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16th Annual 
Cotton Festival 
Huge Success

The 16th annual Hedley Cot­
ton Festival was a huge success, 
thanks to much hard work by 
Lion president Doyle Messer and 
his assistants as well as the girls 
who sold tickets, also to good co­
operation of people of the Hedley 
area, neighboring towns and the 
weather.

The climax of the Festival was 
the crowning of the new Queen, 
Judy Leggitt, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Lloyd Leggitt, by Lion Dep­
uty District Governor Milton 
Morris of Canyon. First runner- 
up was Pam Myers, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Myers, and 
second runnerup was Debbie 
Stephens, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. O. D. Stephens. The queen 
contest raised a total of $1,622,83.

An excellent program was ar­
ranged by Myrtle Reeves, Letha 
Springer, and Mary Ruth White. 
Richard Shaw did a fine job as 
MC. R. M Saunders, on behalf 
of the Lions Club, presented a 
nice gift to each entrant in the 
queen contest.

A sizeable number of old set­
tlers registered Friday for their 
reunion directed by president. 
Bob Ayers. A good program was 
given, and prizes were awarded 
to L  Petty as the oldest man pre­
sent, to Mrs. R. E. Mann as the 
oldest woman present, and to Mr. 
and Mrs. Gus Owens for coming 
the fartherest distance to the re­
union.

A highlight of the Festival wa* 
the grand parade on Saturday. 
The parade included the Sheriff's 
Dept, and Highway Patrol; the 
color guard from the U. S. Army 
Recruiting Station at Amarillo; 
Queen Beverly Phillips on a Fox- 
hall Ford; the Lions Club float; 
the Amarillo AFB Drum and 
Bugle Corps; Horns a Plenty 
from Wellington; Judy Leggitt 
on the West Texas Utilities float; 
the Memphis Cub Scouts; Spicer 
Ambulance; the Clarendon Emer­
gency Unit; Pam Myers on the 
Security State Bank float; the 
Groom Junior High Band; Linda 
Dickson on Telephone bucket 
truck; Tanya White on the 
Greenbelt Electric Coop, float; 
the Clarendon Junior High Band; 
Stone Machinery Co.; the Model 
A Ford Club from Amarillo; 
Sharon Johnson on the Hedley 
Lumber Co. float; the McLean 
Junior High Band: Pat George on 
the Hedley Beauty Shop float; 
Mugsy and the Poor Boys; Pat 
Tisdale on the Moffett Hardware 
float; the Memphis Junior High 
Band; Nancy Saunders on the 
Stafford Grocery float; the Mem­
phis FHA float and three cars; 
the Singer truck; Debbie Ste­
phens on the Potts Grocery float; 
the Cherry Drug car; the Hedley 
Garden Club float; Sam Owens; 
Tom Owens; the Clarendon Boy 
Scouts; the H A M  Dry Goods 
car; Alderson Chevrolet car and 
pickup; the 1919 Study Club and 
Women’s Culture Club float; Doc 
Saye of Memphis; John Deere 
tractors; the Memphis Trail Rid­
ers; the Amarillo riders: the Pa-

Back Tags Will Help In 
Brucellosis Program

Many ranchers are culling their 
cow herds and shipping the cull­
ed cows to market now or will be 
during the next six weeks, ac­
cording to County Agent Ronald 
Gooch. The cows going to Federal 
and State inspected slaughter 
houses could be helping the ran­
cher and Donley County in the 
Brucellosis Recertification Pro­
gram. If these cows had a back 
tag applied, a blood sample would 
be drawn at the slaughter house 
and tested for brucellosis at co­
operative State-Federal labora­
tories and the owner notified of 
the results of the test.

If ranchers in Donley County 
tested 15 per cent of the cows in 
their herds during a three year 
period by using back tags, the 
county would be recertified and 
cattle would not have to be test­
ed on ranches in the county.

Most livestock auctions are par­
ticipating in the back tag pro­
gram and will apply back tags at 
the owners request. Also back 
tag kits are available at the 
County office along with addi­
tional information on the pro­
gram. These kits can be picked 
up by coming by the County 
Agent's office or call and they 
will be mailed to the rancher at 
no cost, Gooch said.

BRONCHO MOTHERS 
SPONSOR BAKE SALE 
SATURDAY. OCT. 21

Broncho Mothers will sponsor 
•  Bake Sale Saturday, October 
21. Food will be on sale begin­
ning at 9:30 a.m. at Landers and 
Ray Super Save, Cliffords’ Gro­
cery, and Junior’s Food Market. 
There will be assorted pies, 
cake, cookies, and brownies to 
choose from. Proceeds from the 
sale will be used to help defray 
expenses of the annual Broncho 
Football banquet which is the 
Broncho Mothers’ only project.

HOSPITAL NOTES

Patients as of Wed., October 
18—Mrs. J. I. Spurgeon, Victor 
Smith, Mrs. C. E. Jackson. Boy 
Blackwell, Mrs. James Trent, 
Major Hudson and Mrs. Bessie 
Lane.

Dismissals — Mrs. F. E. Banis­
ter, W. G. Johnson, Clyde Slavin, 
and Charlie Word.

Broncs Top Canadian 
With Field Goal

by Candy Skalion
A field goal was the difference 

in the Broncho-Wildcat game at 
Canadian last Friday night 
when various drives bogged down 
for both teams.

With about eight minutes 
left in the final quarter, the 
Broncs started a drive on their 
own seven yard line. The deter­
mined blocking of the Broncho 
line and the running of Reese, 
Land, Longan and Mooring kept 
the drive moving until the Wild­
cats shut it down on their own 
15 yard line. At this point Phil­
lip Longan kicked his second 
field goal of the season. This 32 
yard kick proved to be the de­
ciding points. Canadian made a 
last-minute try to score but the 
Broncs tightened their defense 
and held the Wildcats on the five 
yard line.

The remainder af the game was 
a defensive battle with neither 
team making very little headway. 
Clarendon fans were disappoint­
ed in the third period when 
Walter Reese made a long run 
and crossed the goal line, only to 
have it called back due to a clip­
ping penalty.

Loader Classifieds Get Results

ducah Riding Club; the Claren­
don Riding Club and the Hedley 
Riding Club.

For business floats the Security 
State Bank won first, Moffitt 
Hardware second and West Texas 
Utilities third. For organizations 
the Sodolitas Club won first and 
the Garden Club second. For cars 
Potts Grocery won first, H & M 
Dry Goods second and 1919 Study 
Club third. The Security State 
Bank was the overall winner,

In the Junior High Bands Di 
vision, McLean won first, Clar­
endon second and Groom third.

Paducah placed first and Mem- 
D h i s  second for Riding Clubs.

Fertilizer Management, 
Use To Be Highlighted 
At Symposium

The latest information on fer­
tilizer use and management will 
be presented at the Southern 
Great Plains Agronomy Sympo­
sium to be held at West Texas 
State University, Canyon, next 
Thursday, October 26.

Conuty Agricultural Agent 
Ronald Gooch says discussions 
will be featured on the character­
istics, handling and application 
of ammonia: nitrogen transfor­
mations in the soil; fertilization 
of wheat, grain sorghum, cotton, 
sugar beets and vegetables; and 
interrelationships of fertilizer 
use with production practices.

An outstanding slate of leading 
agronomic authorities will be on 
hand to present the program, 
pointed out Gooch.

Presiding at the various ses­
sions of the symposium will be 
Don Margo, president, Texas Fer­
tilizer Association; Dr. Tom 
Longnecker, director. High Plains 
Research Foundation; Dr. Bill 
Longstaff, president, Texas Plant 
Food Educational Society; Dr. A. 
W. Young, head. Department of 
Agronomy and Range Manage­
ment, Texas Tech; and Billy C. 
Gunter, Extension District II ag­
ricultural agent.

Registration for the day-long 
conference will begin at 8 a.m. 
Advance registrations at $5 each 
may be sent to the Agriculture 
Department, West Texas State 
University, Canyon.

Gooch encourages all fertilizer 
dealers and interested agricul­
tural producers in the county to 
attend the symposium.

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Jones, Mike 
and Karen of Dalhart spen 
Thursday night with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Jones, Sr.

Lions 45th Anniversary 
Banquet Tues. Night

The Clarendon Lions Club will 
hold its 45th Anniversary Ban­
quet next Tuesday evening at 
7:30 in the High School Cafeteria.

Lion President, Gene Alderson, 
reports that plans for an out­
standing program are complete 
and one Charter member, J. R. 
Bartlett, will be present for the 
occasion along with Harry Gard­
ner of Amarillo, who presented 
the Clarendon Charter 45 years 
ago. Mr. Gardner, who was Dep­
uty District Governor at that 
time, is now 92.

Rev. Carl Nunn will, serve as 
master of ceremonies for the oc­
casion and a highlight of the pro­
gram will be the Innovations, a 
young musical group f r o m 
Claude.

Speaker for the occasion will be 
R. A. Lipscomb of Lubbock. He 
is the Public Relations Director 
for Lions of Texas and is a past 
International Director. At present 
he is in Puerto Rico attending 
a 50th Anniversary Directors 
meeting of Lions International 
and will fly back especially for 
this occasion. Other dignitaries 
to be present are Kenneth W. 
Waugh, District 2-T-l Governor 
Of Canyon and Joe Gibson, Cab­
inet Secretary, also of Canyon.

It is understood that a dele­
gation from Amarillo will be 
present also. Amarillo Lions were 
the sponsors of the local club on 
October 22, 1922. Representatives 
from other clubs in the area are 
slated to be present also.

The banquet Is open to others 
1 outside of the Lions Club and 
tickets may be purchased from 
Banouet Chairman, Carl All- 
mond or Boss Lion Gene Aider- 
son.

Clarendon-McLean 
Bands To Present 
Combined Show Fri.

This Friday evening, October 
20th, at McLean's Duncan Field 
before the Clarendon-McLean 
football game, the bands from 
these two schools will present a 
combined show, the theme of 
which is "America.” The show 
features precision marching by 
both bands as one unit and some 
pageantry depicting the spirit of 
freedom. There will be 72 band 
members on the field led by both 
drum majors and the four ma­
jorettes.

Both Clarendon and McLean 
will present separate routines at 
halftime. These halftime shows 
will be the contest shows to be 
presented by the bands October 
24th at West Texas State Univer­
sity’s Buffalo Stadium, Canyon.

There are no two bands any­
where that have the same march­
ing styles and techniques, so any­
time a combined marching show 
is presented there must be re­
hearsal time spent on matching 
these styles as much as possible.

Everyone is urged to attend the 
game early to hear both bands 
play one of America’s favorite 
current hits, “Born Free,” and a 
special arrangement of “Amer­
ica.” Both bands will combine 
their talents to play the “Star 
Spangled Banner.”

The combined show starts at 7 
p.m. und is dedicated to everyone 
who is proud to be an American.

Broncs To Open District Play Against 
Tigers At McLean Friday Night

NEW BOYS DORM TO BE . 
NAMED VAUGHAN HALL

At the regular meeting of the 
College Board of Regents last 
week, a resolution was presented 
as a part of the official minutes 
in regard to the naming of the 
new boys dormitory. All members 
of the board were present and 
the vote was unanimous. The 
resolution read as follows:

Whereas the development of a 
college requires foresight, vision, 
and a dream for the future aided 
by acute judgment.

Whereas hard work and dedi­
cation of purposes become neces­
sary to fulfill the mission of the 
institution of higher learning,

Whereas these attributes are 
found in the leadership at Clar­
endon College in its President, 
Kenneth D. Vaughan, to an out­
standing degree,

Be it resolved that the men’s 
dormitory presently under con­
struction be named VAUGHAN 
HALL in honor of Kenneth D. 
Vaughan, and as a tribute to his 
efforts in behalf of the College 
and as a cornerstone for the 
building of higher education at 
Clarendon both in stone and 
mortar and in human enlighten­
ment.

FIRST SIX WEEKS JR. HIGH 
HONOR ROLL RELEASED

8th Grade

The Clarendon Bronchos open 
district play Friday nigut against 
the McLean Tigers. The public 
is urged to follow the team to 
McLean for their 7:30 meeting 
with the Tigers.

As Clarendon fans so well re­
member, McLean ruined the 
Bronchos claim to the district 
championship last season, forcing 
them to settle for a three-way 
tie with McLean and Wheeler.

Clarendon and McLean go into 
this contest rather evenly match­
ed with three wins each. To this 
record the Bronchos add two 
losses and a tie, whereas the 
Tigers have three losses to date. 
They have faced three common 
foes—Memphis, White Deer, and 
Groom.

Clarendon tied 0-0 with Mem­
phis, was defeated 13-0 by White 
Deer, and won over Groom 47-6. 
McLean boasting an 8-0 victory 
over Claude last week, was de­
feated 6-0 by Memphis and 18-6 
by White Deer, but won over 
Groom 14-0.

Both teams are defensive mind­
ed, with McLean having yielded 
only 39 points in six games to 
Clarendon's 47 points. In com­
paring the offensive showing 
of the two clubs, the Tigers have

Colts Victorious Over 
Claude 36-14

The Clarendon Colts, coached 
by Pete Bromley and Bill nrom- 
as, took their game with Claude, 
there, Thursday night by a score 
of 36-14. The Colts scored twice 
in the first quarter, the first 
when Wesley Gardner plunged 
over from the one yard line. Joe 
Shadle converted for 2 points.
Gardner also cinched the second 
TD on a 30 yard run with Larry 
Longan converting for 2 points.

In the second quarter Longan 
took the ball on a 30 yard pass 
from Mack Tomlisnsopi for 6 
points. The 2 point conversion was 
made by Gardner. Claude was 
able to score on a 3 yard plunge 
and converted for 2 points bring­
ing the score to 24-8. Before the 
half ended Larry Longan return­
ed a Claude punt for 65 yards 
and a score but the conversion 
failed.

The second half opened with a 
bang when Longan took the 
opening kickoff and ran 70 yards 
for 6 points. Clarendon’s second 
and third team played the re­
mainder of the game. Claude scored 58 in these |ix  _
scored again in the fourth quarter 1 counters compared to 73 lor the i 
on a 60 yard pass interception Bronchos

aUemPt fOF COnVer,lon Coach Noonk.es ter predict, th*.
I the team making the fewer rois- 

Coaches reported that all of 1 takes will be the w inner at f r i -  
their boys coming out for toot-1 day night’a game. He «aa« that 
ball this season had an oppor- although McLean ia not a flashy 
tunity to play in the game. / ball club, they are w ell- schooled

This week the Colts will travel and make few mistakes.All A’s — J. Lynn Jones, Susie tQ whjte Deer 77,^  ghould ^  an
Price, Mitchell Fedric.

A’s & B’s — Teddy Ashcraft, 
Betty Dromgoole, Johnny Floyd, 
Kent Heath, Eddy Helms, Debbie 
Holland, Bette Hudson, Scotty 
Lindley, James Thomas, Mack 
Tomlinson, Linda Vallance, Steve 
Vaughan, Nelda Allison, Terry 
Elliott, Patricia Hastey, Randy 
Hill, Jeffory Howard, Kent Mc- 
Elroy, Susan Mickelson, John 
Moore, Susan Palmer, Bonnie 
Rogers, Shirley Talley, Julia 
Taylor, Russell Vernon, Gail Wil­
liams, Carolyn Barrow, Betty 
Hampton, Becky Hudson, Steve 
Pointer, and Deborah Shields.

7th Grade
All A’s — Pam Grant.
A’s & B’s — Raenell Alexan­

der, Melissa Estes, John Holland, 
Katrina Messer, Teresa Moore, 
Joni Myers, Dianna Swinney, 
Jeff Campbell, Elaine Ford, 
James Stephens, Debbie Jackson, 
and Tommy Sursa.

6th Grade
All A’s — Douglas Shelton, 

Janet Grant, Shauna Hardin, 
Cynthia Price, Terry Saye.

A’s & B’s — Tommy Hill, Sue 
Luttrell, Sheila Smith, Forest 
Pool, Roger Bass, Terry Eller- 
brook, Johnny Gemer, Johnny 
Just, Gary Lynn Shields, Ken­
neth Tyler, Gary West, Julie 
Wise.

other good game as the 
Deer boys are undefeated.

White

QUALITY JOB PRINTING 
AT THE LEADER

CAPPING OF STUDENT 
NURSES TO BE HELD AT 
GROOM TUESDAY P.M.

Friends in the Clarendon area 
are invited to attend Capping 
exercises for Students of Dr. 
John V. London School of Voca­
tional Nursing, Groom Memorial 
Hospital Tuesday, October 24th, 
at 7:30 p.m. in the Methodist 
Church, Groom, Texas.

Students in the class from Clar­
endon include: Mrs. Willene Judd, 
Mrs. Dovie Knox, Mrs. Mary 
McCrary, and Mrs. Billie Hicks.

Senior end Monte Land 
elected permanent tri-captain to 
serve with Pat Perkins and Larry 
Green during district piay.

The Freshman Team, who bat­
tled to a 6-6 tie With Groom last 
week, will face Panhandle here 
Thursday evening at 6:00 p.m.

Broncho parents and fans are 
reminded that the game film is 
shown each Monday night at the 
High School and that everyone 
is invited to these showings.

Mr. and Mrs. G. W. Estlack 
visited in Hedley and attended
the Cotton Festival Saturday.

GENE SWEARINGEN 
NAMED MANAGER 
OF CITY GAS CO.

It was learned this week that 
Gene Swearingen had been nam­
ed manager of the local office 
of the City Gas Co. to replace 
Cecil McAfee, who has joined a 
branch of Peoples Natural Gas 
Co.

Swearingen has been with the 
company here the pas*, three 
years and has been a long time 
resident of Clarendon. McAfee, 
who has been with City Gas Co. 
the past 12 years, plans to con­
tinue making his home in Clar­
endon. Swearingen is scheduled 
to take over his new duties next 
week.

COTTON CLASSING 
OFFICE TO OPEN OCT.
23 AT MEMPHIS

The Memphis, Texas cotton 
classing office of the U. S. De­
partment of Agriculture will be 
open to receive Smith-Doxey 
samples on Monday, October 23- 

The Memphis office handles 
classing for Armstrong, Briscoe, 
Carson, Childress, Collingsworth, 
Cottle, Donley, Gray, Hall, Hans­
ford, Hemphill, Hutchinson, King, 
Lipscomb. Motley, Ochiltree, Rob­
erts and Wheeler Counties.

Kermit E. Voelkel, who has 
been with the Memphis office for 
the past six years, again will be 
in charge. A 35-year employee of 
USDA, he is a graduate of Texas 
A & M University.

More than 113,000 bales were 
classed at Memphis last year. TTie 
office determines grade, staple 
and micronaire reading on cotton.

Attend the church of your choice 
this Sunday

Saturday-A t left is Miss Judy Leggitt, 1968 Cotton Queen, on the West Texas Utilities float which placed 3rd; Next is Miss Pam Myers, 1st 
JeauUful Floats were abundant in the H * Bank float which was the first piace winner in the parade; next is Debbie Stephens, 2nd runner-up in the Queen coritest nding atop the Potts Grocery
•unner-up in the Q u^n  contest, ndmg h S > b ^  ^  M  right is Miss Pat TisdaIe, another Queen contestant, riding on the Moffitt Hardware float which placed 2nd. (Leader Photos & Engravings)
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GOODNIGHT NEWS
LEE ANN PALMER

Mr*. W. R. Clack, Mr*. O. C. 
Edwards and Mrs. Lee Palmer 
were busy Friday night making 
upcoming holiday candles in the 
home of Mrs. O. C. Edwards.

Rev. and Mrs. O. C. Edwards1

visited Mr. and Mrs. M. L. Allen 
of Tucumcari, N Mex.

Mrs. A. J. Garland visited her 
mother, Mrs. Reed, Sunday even 
ing.

Mr. and Mrs. Andy Anderson 
enjoyed Sunday dinner with Mrs 
Retta Hubbard.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Brumage and 
Mrs. Grady Green visited the 
H. M. Horschlers Friday and 
Saturday. Later the group at-

HOMEN MEAT CO.
CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING & PROCESSING

Country Ham, Bacon Or Sausage
....................................................

BEEF FOR YOUR FREEZER
Prices Below Include Processing

H alf............. Lb.

Front Quarter . Lb. 450
Hind Quarter .. Lb. 610

Slaughtering of Cattle & Hogs Any Week Day
Phone 874-2154 — Box 389 — Clarendon 

JOHN BROOKS. MANAGER

Two views of the Clarendon Jr. High band performing in the Hedley Cotton Festival 
Parade last Saturday.

tended the Hedley Cotton Fes­
tival.

Wednesday Mrs. Gertrude Mar­
shal and Mrs. Patsy Robertson 
visited Mrs. Ben Lovell.

Mrs. Joe Lovell and Leah vis­
ited Mrs. Ben Lovell Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Crain visited the 
H. F. Hazlett family of Phillips 
Friday and Saturday of last 
week. Mr. and Mrs. Leo Smith 
and Sheila of Lelia Lake visited 
the Edwards Saturday.

The Goodnight Homemakers 
held their regular ipeeting Tues­
day afternoon. Mrs. Lena Mae 
Graham, Mrs. Sue Rhoades and 
Mrs. C. C. Horschler were visit­
ing from the Ash tola Commun­
ity.

Sheliah McAnear attended the 
Clarendon Jr. High and Claude 
Jr. High game at Claude last 
Thursday.

Teddy Pool and some friends 
of Clarendon played the Hedley 
High School basketball team last 
week.

Mrs. Harold Graham of Ash- 
tola visited Mrs. Ben Lovell.

Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Clack and 
Mrs. Lee Palmer and Lee Ann 
went to Pampa Saturday to pick 
up Mr. and Mrs. Clack’s new 
car.

Ward Palmer along with his 
teammates went to Claude Thurs­
day night to play Claude Jr. 
High.

Mrs. Henry Wilson, Mrs. Shir­
ley Jones and son and Mrs. Ben 
Lovell visited Mrs. Patsy Rob­
ertson and Mfs. Odell Wallace 
Saturday.

Last Tuesday Mrs. G. A. 
Blankenship, Mrs. L. S. Newberry 
and Rev. and Mrs. O. C. Edwards 
attended the annual Palo Duro 
Association meeting at the High­
land Baptist Church at Pampa.

Saturday afternoon the W. M. 
Crains visited Mrs. Burrows of 
Claude.

GOLDSTON NEWS
Mrs. Roy Roberson

Mr. and Mrs. David Bray spent 
the week end with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert E. Lee, at
Slaton.

Mr. and Mrs. Archie Pool and 
Mrs. Richard Cannon visited 
Wednesday in Lubbock with kin­
folks.

Mrs. H. T. Burton of Claren­
don and Goodwin Bray of Dallas 
were dinner guests Saturday of 
Mr. and Mrs. Archie Pool.

Mr. and Mrs. Archie Pool vis­
ited with Mr. and Mrs. E. V. 
Quattlebaum at Lelia Lake Tues­
day evening.

Dr. and Mrs. Luther Kirk of 
Pampa visited Sunday evening 
with Mr. and Mrs. Archie Pool.

Mrs. Blanche Gray visited 
Tuesday morning with Joy and 
Minnie Roberson.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Sullivan 
and children of Adrian spent the 
week end with her mother, Mrs. 
Joy Roberson, and Minnie, and 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Wes 
Sullivan.

Mrs. Johnny Davis and chil­
dren visited Joy and Minnie Rob­
erson Wednesday morning.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Ray Little­
field and children spent the week 
end with his brother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Littlefield and 
family at Tulia. _______

Knit Shop 
Athlyn’s

“Complete Line of 
Knitting Supplies” 

Box 280
Clarendon. Texas 79228

Mr*. Homer Eatlack 
Phone 874-3560

(43-c)

Mr. and Mrs. E. V. Bowling of 
Amarillo spent the week end with 
their daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernie Collie and girls.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Smith of 
Pampa visited Saturday night 
with her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
Ledbetter.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Ledbetter vis­
ited Friday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Smith in Pampa.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Pritchard 
visited in Wellington Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Pritchard 
and Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Davis 
attended the Cotton Festival at

THURSDAY, OCTOBER 19, 1967
Hedley Saturday.

Joy and Minnie Roberson vis­
ited Sunday evening with Mr. 
and Mrs. Vernon Davis.

Bessie and Ruth Stice and Mr. 
and Mrs. C. J. Williams, all of 
Amarillo, visited Sunday evening 
with Mrs. C. T. Williams.

Mrs. Myrtle Reid of Claude 
visited Saturday evening with 
Mrs. C. T. Williams.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Jackson 
and children of Fort Worth spent 
the week end with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. W. H. McDonald of 
Clarendon.

Anti-Freeze
SPECIAL

Prestone
G a l.  - . $ 1 5 9

(Installation Extra)

ALDERSON CHEVROLET
Clarendon. Texas
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WED., OCT. 25 WED., OCT. 25

NEW AND USED 
TYPEWRITERS & ADDERS 

AT THE LEADER

YOUR FARM BUREAU OFFERS YOU. •- jyjit *
■' Vh'ri

GREAT SAVINGS

ON AUTO TIRES (Prsnisms Only)
SAFEMARK -  ^  A w m  * m m  tfuuUmmmk -
» it l tie 'Hem lux+fuie m tti /4<UU Surety.

FOfc 11XAS FARiV: BUREAU m e m b e r s !!

Patterson Mobil Station
1 BLOCK EAST OF STOP LIGHT ON HIGHWAY 287

Public Auction
Wednesday, Oct. 25th • 10 a.m.

at L. D. ATEN Farm
1 Mile West Of Lelia Lake, Texas, South Side Of Highway 287.

Due To My Health I Will Sell The Following Equipment & Furniture

1—D17 AC Tractor 
1—IHC Hi Boy Spray Burner 
1—Cotton Cleaner 
1—AC Boll Puller 
1—Sand Fighter
1—Whitmore Power Take-Off Grinder 
1—80" Servls Shredder 
1—AC Scraper 
1—IHC 7 Ft One Way 
1—12 Ft. Eaay Flow Fertiliser Spreader 
1— 3  Section Harrow 
1— 3  Point Hook-up Poethole Digger 
1—4 Row Cotton Preea Wheels 
1— 1942 Junk Ford Truck
1— 8 x 12 Metal Shed
3— Antique Trunks
8—Windows With Glass
2— Dressers
1—Lot of Hand Tools 
1—Rocker
1—Tractor Umbrella 
1—Truck Bed
1— 12 Ft. IHC 18-Hole Drill
4— 3 Bale Cotton Trailers 
1—4-Row Godevil
10.000 Lbs. Dellnted Treated Cotton Seed 
1— 14 Ft. Lister Beam  
1—Garden Plow. Motor Powered 
15—White Cross Pullets 
8—White Croes Hens 
1—Air Compressor 
1—Water Pump 
100 Ft \V» In. Plastic Hose 
100 Ft. 1 In. Plastic He

6—55 Gallon Barrels 
4—6 In. 30 Ft. Irrigation Pipe
1— Loading Chute
2— Electric Fans
1—Paths Phonogragh and Records
1—Fire Place Stove
1—Antique Book Shelves
1—Gasoline Motor
1—Sprayer
1—Feeder Trough
1—Old Scratch Cattle Oiler
1—Lot Hog Wire
100 Ft. Steel Cable
1—New Holland Junk Hay Baler
8—Hog Troughs
1—Water Tank. Junk
Lots Of Junk Iron
1—Lot Gin Suction Pipe
1—3 Point Hook-up Ferguson Scratcher
1—Old Row Binder
1—Land Roller
1—Junk Iron Wheel Wagon and Bed
500 Bales Hay Grazer Hay
1—A Frame
1—Ton W Chain Hoist
1—500 Gallon Propane Tank
1 Lot Used Tires
1—Wardrobe

1—L o t s  Seat and Two Matching Chairs. Antique, 
175 Years Old and In Perfect Condition.

LUNCH WILL BE AVAILABLE TERMS: CASH DAY OF SALE

Auctioneers
CLEATUS CALLOWAY
Frederick, Oklahoma

BOB AYERS
Memphis, Texas
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TTiere’* a sign at every crossroad 
Just to guide us on our w a y . 

There’s a light for every darkness 
Bringing hope for our new day.

There’s a guide to show the lost 
ones

Back to safety and new hope. 
When our ship has lost its anchor 
This one throws us out a rope.

Tis' no need to b e  a drifting 
Hopeless and without a sail. 
When the Master of creation 
Offers safety without fail.

Several years ago now we printed 
the first little book from material 
used in this column Right off 
we sold a few hundred to our 
friends and it looked like we 
would be sold out in no time .. 
Then, af*er our neighbors had all 
bought there came a lull and we 
thought that the rush was over 
for good and that the remainder 
would have to be eaten or thrown 
away Then, something happen­
ed that changed things. The edi­
tor of a little magazine called 
Sunshine brought light into our 
day by giving our book a little 
review . .. Orders begin to come in 
from every part of the country 
»rd even overseas. Now, years

later these friends re-order for 
gifts Somehow, we feel that 
the band of the Great Master 
prompted a kind person to throw 
us a  rope when our anchors of 
hope were gone Each one of us 
can no doubt think of so many 
many times in our life when 
some little happening changed a 
part of our life. It makes these 
happenings so much more import­
ant when we believe With all our 
heart that things do happen be­
cause of a purpose greater than 
ourselves.

LELIA LAKE NEWS
Mrs. Pauline Roberts

Excuse us for making predic­
tions, but look out for one of the 
roughest political campaigns of 
all times in next year’s presi­
dential election Even when the 
ground is smooth the politicians 
always find a few rocks to throw. 
But, this time the path will be 
plenty rocky.

Mr. and Mrs. J.A.S. Wood left 
Thursday for Muleshoe to attend 
the funeral of his brother who 
died there Wednesday. We ex- 

jtend our sympathy.
Mrs. E. W. Chenault and Mrs.

I Wayne Chenault and baby of 
Canyon spent the week end here.

Mr. and Mr?. J. L. Butler shop­
ped in Amarillo Saturday.

Mrs. Quinn Aten had minor 
surgery at the hospital in Amar­
illo Tuesday. She is back home 
doing fine.

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Swindle and 
Stephanie of Hereford spent the 
week end with her parents, Mr.
and Mrs. C. C. Ayers.

Mrs. J. H. Bowling was called

to Hugo, Okla. Wednesday by the 
death of her mother. Mr. and 
Mrs. J. H. Bowling, Gregg and 
Gail attended the funeral. We 
extend our sympathy.

Mrs. Barbara Hill and children 
of Amarillo spent the week end 
with her mother, Mrs. A. T. Cast- 
ner.

Lee Usrey of Amarillo spent 
the week end with his brother, 
Mr. and Mrs. O. L. Usrey.

Mrs. C. L. Cook spent the week 
end in Clarendon with her 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. K. K. 
Day. She received medical at­
tention while there.

Mr. and Mrs. Billie Christal 
were in Amarillo most of the 
week to be with their grandson, 
David Word, who is preparing to 
have surgery. Tests were made, 
and David is to have heart sur- 
gry Tuesday morning in the St.

EXPERT
PRESCRIPTION

SERVICE
Bring your prescriptions 
to us for prompt, courte­
ous service.

Y O U *

PHARMACY

Watch for 
Our Ic So/e 

Announcements 
on Television

[M

tlQINJ

J Z  i n £  P E W /
STARTS M ONDAY/ OCTOBER 16^ _

RUBBING
ALCOHOL
First quality! PINT

7ft 2br80c
REX A11 VITAMIN B-l

THIAMINE HYDROCHLORIDE
1-23, 25-mg. 100’s ______2 for 1.24
1.78, 5(Hng. lOO’g _____ 2 for 1.80
3.19v 100-mg. 100's______2 for 3.20
4.88,100-mg. 250-0 ______2 for 4.88

Panovite
I MULTieLB 

y,T A M IM*

REXAIL

PA N O V IT EV N 
MULTIPLE 
VITAMINS

111; 100's 

REG. 2.98

T O I L E T R I E S  & COSMETICS A T  lc S A L E  PRICES

1.38 ANTIHISTAMINE Tablets,
Rexall, 50’s _____________ 2 for 1.40
2.58 VITAMIN B-COMPLEX Tablets,
Recall, 100’s ________________2 for 230
88c VITAMIN B-12 Tablets, 5mg.,
Rexall, 100’s ________________2 for 31
1.18 FUN6I-REX LOTION, 2 oz„
OINTMENT, 1% or........ .....2 for 120
88c BI0KETS THROAT TROCHES,
15’s, LOZENGES, 10’s _________ 2 for .89
59c SODA MINTS, Rexall. 140’s 2 for .60

REXALL
DUSTING 
POWDER

i of four fragrances: Twig, 
Adrienne, American Beauty Rose 
and Lavender.

reI . ° i > 5  w  2  for ! e 7  6

y

n

U fU if "CELEBRATION"
AEROSOL COLOGNES
_ Mardi-Gras, Carnival, 
3  oz. Pageant or Fiesta

REGA 2*50 2 for 2.51
2.50 COLOGNE, American Beauty Ro m
Mirt, 3 oz. aeroso l----------------- 2  far 211
1.50 COLOGNE, American Beauty Rose
or Twig, 2 *4  o z.---------------------- 2  far l i t

01c FAST DANDRUFF SHAMPOO. 8 oz. 
M IT E  CONDITIONING RINSE. 8 OZ. or 
BEL DANDRUFF RINSE. 4  OZ. tube______

*  \ 
______ 2 far .M

79c MINERAL OIL, Rexall, Pint-. 2 for 30
55c EPSOM SALT, Rexall, 1 lb_2 for 38
35c ZINC OXIDE OINTMENT,
Rexall, 1 oz. „----------------------2 for 38
79c CAMPHORATED OIL, Rexall,
4 o r.------------------------------- 2 for 30
73c WITCH HAZEL, Rexall Pint 2 for .74
1.49 BREWER’S YEAST Tablets,
Rexall, 250’s --------------------- 2 for 130
49c COLD SORE OINTMENT,
Rexall, *4 oz.----------------------2 for .50

1.50 C0U) ar CLEANSING CREAM, 3*4 oz.
2.50 HORMONE CREAM, 2*4  0 Z ._______
2.00 NI8HT CREAM, 2 *4  o z .____________

-2  f a r m  
.2  far 211  
- 2  far 2.01

<0  K  w
IX
09c AFTER SHAVE LOTION, Lavender or
Redl-Shave, 5  oz.

PRE-SHAVE Ii LOTION, Lavender or Redl-Shave
_2 far .70 J  
-Her 10

. LAVENDER SHAVE CREAM, Aerosol, Regular
Menthol. 11 o z .______________________________ 2  lo r .00

BAY RilM , Rexall, P in t______________________ 2  ter 1 0

89cFUNGI-REX F00TP0WDER, 4oz. 2 for 30
I I99c ASPIRIN, 10*r.,Rexall, 100’s 2 for 130

SA V E  NOW ON F A M I L Y  N E E D S

SPUNTEX
SUPPORT
NYLONS

Seamed or seamless.

4*5 2 hr 4.96

r GLYCERIN 
SUPPOSITORIES

J a r  o f  12

2 for 54cREO.
5 3 c

39c t  89e DENTAL FLOSS, Rexall,
30 and 100 yd s.-------------------------
25c SHOE LACES

2  for 1 0  and 2 for 3 0
1 packs ter 26

25c HAIR or WAVE Nets, pack of 3 ----------------- 2 packs for 3 1
65c 1 1 1 5  BRIDGE DECKS, Lady Baltimore.
Single or Double_______________________2  for .61 and 2 for I H
25c SURE SEAL ENVELOPES, Social Business. A ir Mail 2 for 3 1
1.98 BILLFOLDS, LEATHER, Ladies’, Men’s -----------------2  for 1.99
25c "Y E S  ” D ISPOSABLE P E N -----------------------------------2»0f 3 9
39c A  59e BABY PANTS. Vinyl Bloomer 2  fo r 1 0  and 2  (or .90 
39c NAIL P0U SH  REMOVER, Rexall. 4  OZ.------------------ 2  for 1 0

DICALCIUM 
PHOSPHATE loos

??• 2 for 1.40
RIXA IL

HAIR SETTING
GEL

™  2 for 1.26

KLENZO
TOOTH 

BRUSHES
5 Types

M 3 .  .4 9  2for50c
89c Natural Bristle,
2  typos ------ _2 for .70
29c A  39c Youth’s.
Child’s ----------- 2  for 1 0

and 2 far .40

10*11
BUBBLE BATH

20 packets 
REO . 6 5 c

2 for 66c
REXALL

RO-BAll
DEODORANT i or
6G 2 for 70c

•IlMONT RUBOtt

HOUSEHOLD
GLOVES

REO.
».V 2 for 90t

F I R S T  A I D  N E E D S

R E X A LL  
W A T iR P R O O F

ADHESIVE
TAPE

REO . 2 9 c  to  7 9 c

2 for 30c to 
2 for 80c

R EX A LL

TRI-SALVE
OINTMENT

*4 -oz.tub o  
REO . 9 8 c

2 for 99c
35c to 80c GAUZE BANDAGE.
Sterile, Rexall______3  far .38 to 2  far 4 1
M o  AEROSOL MERTHIOLATE*,
Thlmerosel Lilly, 1 o z .___ _____3  for .99
1.19 BACITRACIN OINTMENT,
Antibiotic, Rexall, *4  oz. tube— 2  far 1.20

S T A T I O N E R Y  S U P P L I E S
BOXED

WRITING , 
PAPER

Plain or decorated. 
Envelopes 

REG. 98c

2hr99( J
99c BOXED NOTES_________ 3  far 1 9
99c POUND PAPER, ENVELOPES

...2 packs fer .99
1.00 CHRISTMAS CARDS, Boxed,
"Cascade'’ ________________ 2 far 1.01

A
Ucoroi

ALCO-REX

RUBBING
ALCOHOL

PINT
REO. 59c

2 for 60c
RIXAIL

SACCHARIN
Bottles of 1000 each

98c, *4-gr____ 2 for .99

139, *4 -g r. 2 for 1 1 0

1 .99 ,1-gr.___ .2 far 1.70

CLIFTON FEVER
THERMOMETERS

3 types

K  2  for 1 .9 6
LYCRA* SPANDEX

SUPPORT HOSE
Seamless 

RIO. S I S  PAIR

2 Pr. for 5.96

XMAS CARDS
Religious Box

REO.
1.00 2  far 1.01
----EXBimnSHFs----

HAIR BRUSHES
REO. 2.00 to 3.00

2 for 2.01 
to 2 for 3.01

7»c HAIR BRUSH, 2 fer 1 0

REXALL t 'r -G A U O NVAPORIZER
2 for 9.96

ELECTREX 3-MEAT

H E A T I N G
P A D

”°5 2 lor 6.96

REXALL

VITAMIN C
ASCORBIC ACID

Bottles of 100 Tablets 
113, 100-mg. -2  fer 1.04
77c, 50-mg____2 fer .78
2.13, 250-mg. . 2 fer 2.14
3.89, 500-mg. ..2 for 3.90
2.89, 100-mg., Chew- 
ables, 250’s ...2 fer 2.90

REXALL
ASPIRIN

5-gr. tablets 
100’s

7Q- FOR 
tifC TWO

REXALL
BUFFERED

ASPIRIN
100’s

m m

REXALL
MONACET

APC
Tablets

130 TWO

REXALL Mi-31 
MOUTHWASH

Antiseptic
PINT

1.09 TWO

REXALL

TOOTHPASTE
Reg. or 
Fluoride 

694 ox. AQ„ FORy y c  two

RFTAt.Y,
BR1CHTENER

TOOTHPASTE
694 os.

1.06 TWO

REXALL 
BRITE SET

HAIR
SPRAY

1.15 S r o

REXALL
BRITE

CONDITIONING
SHAMPOO

7 oz.
QQn FOR
U j C t w o

REXALL 
CARA NOME

HAND CREAM
4-ox. far 

QQr  FOR 
V U L  TWO

REXALL 
CARA NOME

HAND
LOTION

9 9 c  SB>

REXALL
REDI-SHAVE

Aerosol SHAVE
CREAM ii  os.

Reg or Menthol
QQa  f o ry y c  t w o

REXALL
EMERALD

BRITE

SHAMPOO
Tvs.

QQ/» FORy y c  t w o

REXALL 
COOL BLUE 

ROLL-ON
DEODORANT

2 oz.
• QQr F O R  Sflft TWO

REXALL 
COOL BLUE

CREAM
DEODORANT

1 or,
7 (L . FOR
l« 7 t  t w o

REXALL
REDI-SPRAY

DEODORANT

99c fw o

REXALL
^FAST

PERMANENTS
Five Types

EACH 1.00

REXALL
KLENZO

MOUTHWASH
Antiseptic

PENT
1 AA POR

REXALL 
BLUE ORAL

MOUTHWASH
Antiseptic

PIN T

1.09 FOB

REXALL 
Timed Action

COLD
CAPSULES

1 0 's

1.54 &Ro

REXALL 
One Tablet Daily

MULTI­
VITAMINS

100’s
1  Q O  FOR 
I .J O  TWO

REXALL
MinuteMan
VITAMINS
Chew&bles

100*

9 f i7  FORL . \ ) l  T W O

HAIR DRYER. ’’Lady Vanity 
Deluxe” . -14.99 
ELECTRIC TOOTHBRUSH,
Cordless Sunbeam ..................  9.99
LADY SUNBEAM SHAVER___6.99
LADY SUNBEAM SHAVER, n .l.rr . MnU  ..... 0.99

7-PC. KITCHEN TOOL S E T ___2.99
RUG RUNNER, Nylon-Viscose,
24* x 60” _  ----------  1.77
AM/FM RADIO, 20-Traneistor---- 17.97
WESTCLOX ELECTRIC ALARM
CLOCK. Plain . - ........3.31
WESTCLOX ELECTRIC ALARM 
CLOCK, Luminous------------------------- 3.8iMEN S ELECTRIC SHAVER,

“Shnvfmfltli'r” 1 S 90
SUNBEAM 2-SLICE TOASTER.. 12.88 
MF.N’S SUNBEAM SHAVER.... 12.67

GENERAL ELECTRIC ALARM 
CLOCK ’’Snooze Alarm” ------------- 12.99

M A N Y  M O R E  I T E M S  O f 4 S A L E . .  . H U R R Y  IN !

TUNNELL PHARMACY
The Rexall Store

Anthony Hospital. Our prayers 
are for this little boy, and we 
feel sure the results will be good 

Mr. and Mrs. L. L. Jester of 
Altus, Okla. were here Thurs 
day to be with Mr. and Mrs. 
Elmer Dishman and see their 
father, W. H. DeBord, who is ill 
in the Groom Hospital.

Mrs. Lois Moffitt of Amarillo 
and Mrs. Alice Wall of Wellington 
stopped by to visit Mr. and Mrs, 
F. A. Floyd, Mrs. Harold Moffitt 
and Mary Lynn Sunday.

E. R. Myers visited in Amarillo 
Thursday and Friday.

Those visiting Mr. and Mrs. E 
E. Fox over the week end were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Watkins of 
Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. Carol 
Stepp and Melony of Briscoe, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wiley Reynolds, Mrs. 
Alma Gerner of Clarendon, and 
Mrs. Bertha Gerner of Amarillo. 
Mrs. Stepp, who is ill, remained 
for one week.

Mr. and Mrs. Darrell Munger 
and boys of Fritch visited Sun­
day with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. E. D. Head.

Mr, and Mrs. L. C. Myers and 
Kathy of Amarillo spent the week 
end with his father, E. R. Myers 
and Glenn.

Mrs. Ruby McDowell of Mem­
phis spent the week end with 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Kinch 
Leathers.

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Mills and 
son spent the week end in Nara 
Visa, N. Mex.

Visiting in the home of the 
Cecil Mills were Mr. and Mrs. 
Wiley Mills and baby, and Mr. 
and Mrs. R. D. Bowles of Gould, 
Okla.

Mrs. Opal Clayton and Ta­
mara of Memphis visited Wed­
nesday with her mother, Mrs. 
A. T. Castner.

Mrs. Mae Wilkerson of Mem­
phis visited Wednesday with Mr. 
and Mrs. W. C. Scott. Chester

Scott of Amarillo visited Thur*-
day.

George and Donald Shield# vis­
ited in Lawton, Okla. Sunday.

Mrs. Adell Hurst and Mrs. 
Earl Fox visited Mrs. Carol S tepp  
in the hospital in W heeler Wed­
nesday. Melony Stepp returned  
home with them.

Mr. and Mrs. Morris C astner 
of Lubbock spent the week en d  
with Mr. and Mrs. R. D. Castner 
and Cathy.

Those visiting Mr. and Mrs. O. 
L. Usrey Sunday were, Mr. and  
Mrs. Dorman Usrey, Mrs. L a- 
Verne Bannister of Amarillo, 
Mrs. Cleo Crutchfield of Claren­
don, and daughter Jeanett Blev­
ins of Vega, and Mr. and Mrs. 
James Shields and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Boyd Landers of 
Muleshoe visited Mrs. Adell 
Hurst and family over the week 
end.

Those visiting in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. L. R. Foster were 
Mr. and Mrs. Cicero Turpen, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Roy McCracken and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Butch 
Turpen and children all of the 
Rowe Ranch, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Leon Foster of Ashtola.

RODDYS PLUMBING 

& ELECTRIC

Located on Highway 287 
Across from Chamberlain Mata* 

Co.. Clarendon, Taxaa

Services Include — Plumbing, 
Wiring. Heating. Cesspool* 

Ptunped Out. Duct Installation. 
Water Well Service

Slate k  City Licensed k  
PHONE 874-2578

j t O ’55 t h r o u g h

f% W A S H I» A Y

CARE TO 
WALTZ, LADY?

JUST TO SEE
me in action at your local Waltz Through 
Washday appliance dealer or WTU. {$10.00 
&+C Green Stamps.)* ,•C ertificate

FR EE W IR IN G
Normal 220-volt— to WTU residential 
customer* who buy an electric dryer 
or combinetion from e local dealer.

[for FRIQIDAIRRl- a---
F*[ ...-IM W.lUJ

J WestIexas Utilitie
Company I
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1926 Book Club Enjoys 
Hobby Program Tues.

Members of 1926 Book Club 
enjoyed a program on Hobbies at 
their regular meeting Tuesday 
afternoon at Patching Club 
House. Meeting was opened with 
prayer by Mrs. L. N. Cox after 
which Mrs. C. E. Bairfield, pro­
gram leader, introduced the sub­
ject for the afternoon. Many in­
teresting hobbies were presented. 
In conclusion Mrs. L. N. Cox 
showed colored slides of Yellow­
stone National Park after the 
«juake and of areas to the north­
west into Canada.

Attending were three guests: 
Mesdames O. C. Edwards, R. S. 
Brumley, Forrest Sawyer; and 
members Mesdomes C. E. Bair­
field, J. R. Brandon, Fred Cham­
berlain, Jr. Jack Clifford, Beryl 
Clinton, L. N. Cox, W. M. Crain, 
A. J. Garland, Doyce Graham, 
Otis Naylor, Harold Phelps, W. 
N. Poole, W. C. Thornberry, and 
Mias Inez Blankenship.

Hostesses were Mrs. W. M. 
Crain and Mrs. C. E. Bairfield.

—Rep.

OES SALAD SUPPER TO 
BE HELD THURSDAY

The Order of the Eastern Star 
Deputy's official visit here will 
be Thursday, October 19. The oc­
casion will be marked by a salad 
supper at the Masonic Hall at 
6:30 p.m. to be followed by the 
regular meeting at 7:30 p.m. The 
membership is invited.

Mu Gamma Chapter, 
Beta Sigma Phi 
Entertains Rushees

Mu Gamma Chapter of Beta 
Sigma Phi held its October 12th 
meeting in the home of Mrs. Billy

Mr. And Mrs. U. J. 
Boston Honored At 
Tea Sunday Afternoon

Mrs. Delbert i Earl Shields.Mac Hicks with 
Reed, co-hostess.

A salad supper and model 
meeting was held for rushees and 
guests. Attending were Mesdames 
Billy Spier, Tommy Powell, John 
Payne, Keith Hudson, and Larry 
Kingsley, rushees; and members 
Mesdames Ronald Bailey, Sher­
man Cosper, A. J. Garland, Ron 
aid Gooch, Richard Hadley, Billy 
Mac Hicks, Carl Irlbeck, Milton 
Mann, Dennis Rattan, Delbert 
Reed, Leonard Selvidge, Jeff 
Walker, Misses Joan Gover and 
Melody Swauger.

The program was presented by 
the sponsor, Mrs. A. J. Garland, 
who spoke on the History and 
Goals of Beta Sigma Phi. —Rep

Mr. and Mrs. U. J. Boston ot 
Amarillo were honored at a 
Sunday afternoon at th« Church 
of Christ parsonage. Mrs. Boston 
is the former Miss Marjorie Har­
lan.

Robert C. Jones greeted the 
guests. Receiving hours were 
from 3 to 5 p.m.

The refreshment table was 
laid with a lace cloth and cen­
tered with an arrangement of 
pink roses. Appointments were 
silver. Presiding alternately were 
Mrs. Emmett Bobbitt and Mrs

ASHTOLA NEEDLE CLUB
The Ashtola Needle Club will 

meet Thursday, October 19, at 
2:30 p.nfr In the home of Mrs. H. 
S. Mahaffey. Homemade pillow 
cases will be the topic of the 
program brought by Mrs. Harold 
Graham. Bring yours for ideas to 
exchange. —Rep.

—-  ......

ADULT TAILORING 
CLASSES ENROLL 34

Thirty-four home seamstresses 
are enrolled in the Adult Tailor' 
ing Classes now in progress at 
Clarendon High School under the 
direction of Mrs. Velma Bour- 
land, Home Economics instructor. 
This group is engaged in making 
coats, suits, and ensembles from 
unusual materials and in the 
latest designs. A few are making 
sport coats for their husbands 
and/or children.

Simplicity of the techniques 
used in tailoring are being dem­
onstrated and individual fittings 
and conferences are scheduled so 
that these garments can be made 
within the next three to four 
weeks. This course is a part of 
the regular program of work of 
the Clarendon Chapter of Young 
Homemakers.

Mrs. Boston was presented 
silver to complete her service 
and several pieces of decorative 
glassware.

Approximately thirty - five 
guests called. Hostesses were 
Mrs. H. G. Bobbitt, Mrs. Dee 
Smith, Mrs. Naomi Cflbreth, 
Mrs. Gordan Mann, and Mrs. 
Ira Page. —Rep.

TOPS NEWS
The Trimrock TOPS Club met 

Monday night with seven mem­
bers and one visitor present. 
Weights were recorded.

After the meeting members ad­
journed to the home of our lead­
er, Til lie Anglin, for refresh­
ments, and to make plans to 
attend a TOPS meeting in Pampa 
Saturday where we will learn 
new ideas, obtain low calorie 
recipes, and hear ways to im­
prove our club.

If you are over weight and 
want to lose pounds sensibly, 
we invite you to come visit our 
club at the next meeting Mon­
day night, October 23, at 7:30 
p.m. For information call 2530, 
Clarendon. —Rep.

This is the Federated Club’s entry in the Hedley Festi­
val Parade Saturday. (Leader Photo & Engraving)

GAMMA KAPPA CHAPTER, 
DELTA KAPPA GAMMA  
MEETS IN MEMPHIS

]

Stripes with zip. . .  two toned, thick and thin, cut 
to dashing lines byCarlye and topped with a deep 
cuff collar. Oversized zipper and buckled leather 
belt accent the importance of metaL In luxurious 
double faced wool.

USE OUR "LAY-A-WAY 
TIL CHRISTMAS PLAN" NOW

J O H N ’ S

CHAMBERLAIN 
CENTER NEWS

The Chamberlain Community 
will meet at the center Friday 
night. Sandwiches, cake or cook­
ies will be served.

Hostesses will be Mrs. Donald 
Ballew and Mrs. Bob Williams.

—Rep.

GOOD NEIGHBORS CLUB
The Good Neighbors Club met 

with Bessie Helton Friday, Octo­
ber 13. A covered dish luncheon 
was enjoyed by members: Ruby 
Jordan, Carrah Mixon, Alta 
Spradlin, Rosa Bingham, the hos­
tess, and one visitor, Mr. Helton.

We pieced blocks for a quilt. 
Tresa Hughes received a polly- 
anna gift.

Our next meeting will be with 
Blanche Gray Friday, October 
27. We will quilt. Remember 
there are only three more meet­
ings before our Christmas party. 
Each one try to make these.

—Rep.

Gamma Kappa Chapter 
Delta Kappa Gamma held 
regular meeting at Travis School 
Cafetorium in Memphis Saturday 
afternoon. Memphis members 
were hostesses.

During the business session 
membership dues were collected 
Mrs. Della Icenhower, a trans 
fer member from Borger to Chil­
dress, was introduced. A resume 
of the year’s program was given 
and members were urged to at­
tend the Regional to be held in 
Perryton November 4.

Clarendon members attending 
were Miss Edgar Mae Mongole, 
Miss Mable Mongole, Miss Inez 
Blankenship, Mrs. Zola Donald, 
Mrs. Velma Bourland, Mrs. Na­
omi Gilbreth and Mrs. Lucile 
Naylor. —Rep.

KK KLUB ENTERTAINED IN 
HEATH HOME THURSDAY

MIDWAY CLUB NEWS
The Midway Club will meet 

October 26th with Allie Quattle- 
baum at the school house. Bring a 
covered dish. —Rep.

NEW ARRIVAL
Lori Lynn is the name of the 

little miss who came to make her 
home with Mr. and Mrs. Buddy 
Brunson of Lubbock, October 9. 
Grandparents are Mrs. Brunson 
of Slaton and Mr. and Mrs. Othel 
Elliott of Clarendon.

H. D. CLUB NEWS
The Home Demonstration Club 

will meet in the home of Mrs. Bill 
Pool Friday, October 20 at 3:00 
p.m. —Rep.

A LL E L E C T R IC  
W ATER HEATER

rtrr.-jrC3

A 10 YEAR DEPENDABLE 
SER VIC E 6UARANTEE 

&
FREE WIRING

Free 220 volt wiring to ill red­
den till cuMomen ot WTU who 
buy an electric water beater 
from local dealer.

RODDY'S PLUMBING 
St ELECTRIC 
Phooo 174-257

Mrs. G. C. Heath entertained 
the Kil Kare Klub in her home 
Thursday afternoon, October 13. 
The group enjoyed visiting and 
planning for the annual Christ­
mas party. At our next meeting 
we will draw names for polly- 
annas.

The hostess served sandwiches, 
spice cake, and coffee to mem­
bers: Mesdames J. R. Bartlett, 
Clyde Gilbert, S. W. Lowe, Harry 
Brumley, Nolie Simmons, and A. 
H. Moore. —Rep.

SCHOOL
CAFETERIA MENU

October 23-27
Monday — Hamburger on Bun, 

Tater-Tots, Fruit, Lettuce, On­
ions, Pickles, Cookies, Milk.

Tuesday — Chip-O-Pie, Com, 
Green Salad, Fruit Pie, Milk, 
Bread.

Wednesday—Steak with Gravy, 
Creamed Potatoes, Green Limas, 
Hot Rolls, Butter, Jelly, Milk.

Thursday — Ham with Cheese 
Sandwich, Pea Salad, Potato 
Chips, Prune Cake, Milk.

Friday — Turkey with Dress­
ing, Gravy, Sweet Potatoes lyith 
Marshmallows, Green Beans, 
Cranberry Sauce, Hot Rolls, But­
ter, Milk.

Lh 4 »  Classifieds Gat Results

I Im m rv*  D U tr ic t N o. 11 S ta te  N o . t i t

R E P O R T  O P  C O N D IT IO N  O P

THE FARMERS STATE BANK
A N D  T R L S T  C O M P A N Y

o f  C la re n d o n , D on ley C o u n ty . T « i m . a t  th e  r le o e  e f  hvaineaa O cto b e r 4, 1M 7, 
•  a ta te  b a n k in g  In s ti tu tio n  o rg a n ise d  an d  e p e ra t in g  u n d e r  th e  h e n h in g  la w s  
a f  th ia  S ta t e  a n d  a  m em ber e f  th e  F e d e ra l R ese rv e  S y t — . P ahH ahed  in  a c ­
co rd a n c e  w ith  a  ca ll n o d e  by th e  S ta te  B a n k ia g  A n th e r i t ie e  a n d  by th e  F ed ­
e ra l R ese rv e  D is tr ic t .

A S S E T S

C a ih , b a la n c e s  w ith  o th e r  b an k a , a n d  cash  llam a In
p ro cess  o f  co llec tion  ______________ __. . . . . . ___ . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  fl.640.K 61.S2

U n ite d  S ta te s  G o v e rn m e n t o b lig a tio n *  . . . . . __. . . __. . . ___ . . . . . . __  728,192.76
O b lig a tio n s  o f  S ta ten  a n d  p o li t ic a l  subdiv ision* ____________ __. . .  400.901.98
S e c u r i t ie s  o f  F e d e ra l ag c n c ie a  a n d  c o rp o ra tio n s  . . . . . . ___________  89.887.60
O th e r  s e c u r i t ie s  ________________.______ ______________________ ______ 81,929.99
O th e r  lo a n s  a n d  d isco u n ts  . . . . __________ _______ __. . . _____ __. . .  9,974.124.82
B an k  p ro m isee , f u r n i tu r e  a n d  f ix tu re s ,  a n d  o th e r

a s s e ts  re p re s e n t in g  b a n k  p rom isee  _____________ _____ __________  112,874.49
R ea l e s ta te  ow ned  o th e r  th a n  b a n k  p r e m i s e s ____ __. . . . . . ___ . . . . .  4.411.90
O th e r  a se e te  _________________________________________________________  760.09

T O T A L  A S S E T S  __________________________________________  86.888.884.96

LIABILITIES

D em a n d  d ep o s its  o f  in d iv id u a ls , p a r tn e r s h ip s ,  a n d  c o rp o ra t io n s  — 2,474,461.44
T im e  a n d  s a v in g s  dep o s its  o f  in d iv id u a ls , p a r tn e r s h ip s

a n d  c o rp o ra t io n s   - —  -----. . . ------------------- ---— _____________  8.801.808.96
D ep o s its  o f  U n ite d  S ta te s  G o v e rn m e n t . . . . . . . . __________________  8,970.61
D ep o s its  o f  S ta te s  a n d  p o li t ic a l  subd iv isions . . . . . . ----------*---------  188.014.00
C e r t if ie d  a n d  o f f ic e rs ' checks, e tc . -----------------------      9,618.11
T O T A L  P E P O S IT 8  . . . . -----------------------------------------  $6,482,868.12

(a )  T o ta l d e m an d  d ep o s its  . . . ----------. . . . . . . -------- - 2.618.799.06
<b) T o ta l  t im e  a n d  s a v in g s  dep o s its  -----------------88.868,564.06

T O T A L  L IA B IL IT IE S  --------------------------------------------------------  16.482.868.12

C A P IT A L  A C C O U N TS

C om m on s to c k — to ta l  p a r  v a l u e ------ -------- ------------------ -------------— .  189,090.99
N o. s h a re s  a u th o r is e d  1699 
N o . s h a re s  o u ts ta n d in g  1899

S u rp lu s  ______________________________________________________________  1 2 I M 4 M
U n d iv id e d  p r o f i t ,  ------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 126.281.88

T O T A L  C A P IT A L  A C C O U N T S  ---------------------------------- ------  401.281.8S

T O T A L  L IA B IL IT IE S  A N D  C A P IT A L  A C C O U N T S -------- 86,881,614.95

MEMORANDA

A v e r , r e  o f  In te l  d ep o e it, f o r  th e  I I  e» Iend» r d e v , e n d in g
w ith  c a ll  d a te  ................................................................................ ....................  S .II7 .477 .S8

A v e ra g e  o f  to te !  lo a n ,  f o r  th e  IS  c a le n d e r  day* r a d io *
w ith  c a l l  d a te  --------------------------—— ------■-------- — --------------— . . .  4,091.508.OS

L o a n ,  a ,  «hnw n In " A w e i ,"  a r e  a f t e r  d rd n rtlo n
o f  v a lu a tio n  rw e rv e e  o f  ----------------- — -------------- — . . . _ — - -  11,744.57

S e e u r i t le , «■ -h e w n  In  “ t a d f  a r e  a f te r  d educ tion
o f  v a lu a tio n  re w rv e e  o f  -----------------------------------------------------------  1,787.2*

1. J e e  T . L ov e ll, V ! c c - P r . l d e n t ,  o f  th e  above-nam ed  b a n k , do  eo lem n lv  (w e a r  
t h a t  t h b  r e p o r t  o f  co n d itio n  ic t r u e  to  th e  bea t o f  m y  know ledge a n d  belief.

J O E  T . L O V E L L
C a r r a e t - A t ta e t :

J .  D . S W IF T  
V A N  K E N N E D Y  
P R A N K  W H IT E , J R . D ire c to rs

S ta t e  o f  T e n ,  C o u n ty  o f  D onley  e a t

S w o rn  to  a n d  aubaeribed  b e fo re  m e th ia  17th day  o f O cto b e r, 1»«7.

(SEAL) VIOLA B. GRAHAM

M y com m it* io n  e x p ir e ,  8-1-8*
N o ta ry  P u b lic

A wild oat species introduced 
into this country from the Medi­
terranean region could serve as 
foundation for major increase in 
protein reports the U. S. Dept 
of Agriculture. Scientists found

that collections of the wild spe­
cies contain high protein, high 
kernel weight and disease re­
sistance. They are now working 
to breed these good traits into 
commercial oat varieties.

aummse ammus
Fo rt W orth

Star-Tologram
No Incroaso on Annual M ail Ratos

NOW!
FOR A LIMITED TIME 

YOU CAN SUBSCRIBE TO

THE Fort Worth 
Star-Telegram
by mail and save monayl

Morning with Sundayim m g s 
Reg. $28.80 
You save $9.85

M orning except Sunday 
Reg. 421.00 
You save $6.05

Em aiaf editioa m eihhle 
a t lull rale

BY MAIL IN TEXAS AND BORDERING STATES ONLY
Expanded news coverage of the Star-Telegram means a 
greater STATE newspaper for you then ever before, more 

nd worm *sports coverage and women's news, too . . . more than 
any other Texas newspaper. There’s more reading enjoy­
ment for every member of the family . . . that’s why we 
nay LIVING IS BETTER with the Fort Worth Star-Telegram. 
And if you subscribe now, you can save.

Fin out and mail to the Star-Telegram today 
or see your hometown agent

roar m m t m  s t m -t u e g im m
400 W. 7», rert Wert*. Tam 7*101

S ir  S tacked h ckack er raouey erder fer f_

□  Mgnilut udk Sunday
■ ' ili

□  M anias uhfcoet Sunday

ADDRESS-

CITY_

STATE— _ 2 ir  NO..

S ta U  B an k  N a. 141 F e d e ra l R eaerve  D is tr ic t  N e . 11

R E T O R T  O F C O N D IT IO N  O F  T H E

DONLEY COUNTY STATE BANK
W  C la re n d o n  In tk e  S ta U  a t  T e x as  a t  tk e  rlooe „ f  k u rin e m  on  O ctoker 4 . 19*7

A S S E T S

C ask , ba lan ce#  w ith  o th e r  b a n lu ,  an d  cash  i te m , in
p roecaa  o f  eu llee tion  ------------------------------------------------------__---------J1.J74.WX>-**

U n ite d  S t ,  t o .  G o v e rn m e n t o b lig a tio n s  ___________________________  t62.812.S8
O b lig a tio n s  o f  S ta te s  a n d  p o litic a l s u b d i v i s i o n , _______________  8S S .14S .lt
S ecu ritie a  o f  F e d e ra l ag e n c ie s  a n d  c o rp o ra t io n ,   _____________  180,000.00
O th e r  lo a n ,  a n d  dU coun t*  ----------— --------- ---------- ! „ ____ _________ I.068.297X S
B an k  p re m is e ,,  f u r n i tu r e  a n d  f ix tu r e , ,  a n d  o th e r

m e e ts  re p re s e n t in g  b a n k  p r e m i s e s  - — - — ---------------- ----- -----  82.822.62
O th e r  aaeeU   ------ --------------- ---------- ---------- — ----------------------------------  81.81S.0#

T O T A L  A 8 8 K T S  __________________________________________ $8,476,296.15

L IA B IL IT IE S

D em and  d e p o s it ,  o f  in d iv id u a l ,,  p a r tn e r s h ip ,  a n d  c o r p o r a t i o n , ------  2,076,722.11
T im e a n d  s e e in g ,  d e p o e it, o f in d iv id u a ls , p a r tn e r s h ip s ,

a n d  c o rp o ra t io n s  .   ____ _—  -------- ---------— - — . . . . . . ----------  2.068.024.90
D eposits  o f  U n ite d  S ta t e ,  G o v e rn m en t ------ —---------- ---------------- 27.067.86
D eposits  o f  S ta te s  a n d  p o litic a l su b d iv is io n , ----------------------------- 878.218.80
D eposits  o f  co m m erc ia l b a n k s  . . . . ----- — -------------------------------------- - 2,600.00
C ertif ie d  a n d  o f f ic e rs ’ c h e c k ,, e tc . ----------------------------------------------- 16.900.TS
T O T A L  D E P O S IT S  .................................................................... S6.064.484.68

(a )  T o ta l d em an d  dep o s its  ---------------------------------  12.846,814.78
lb )  T o ta l t im e  a n d  s a v in g ,  d e p o s i t , ---------------—.  $2,717,610.90

T O T A L  L IA B IL IT IE S  ____________________ 2______________  S6.064.484.6S

C A P IT A L  A C C O U N T S

C om m on i t o r k —to ta l  p a r  v a l u e ---- ----------- —--------------—_______—  100,000.00
N o. s h a re s  n n tb o riced  1000 
N o . s h a re s  o u ts ta n d in g  1000

S u rp lu s  _________________________ _______ _____ ____________ _________—  14I.OOO.SO
U nd iv id ed  p r o f i t s --------- . . . . — — ----------------- -------- -------------------------142,741.70
R eserve  fo r  co n tin g e n c ie s  a n d  o th e r  c a p i ta l  iw c n e e  __ 29.110.S2

T O T A L  C A P IT A L  A C C O U N T S  __________!______________  411.6SO.St

T O T A L  L IA B IL IT IE S  A N D  C A P IT A L  A C C O U N T S  . .  SS.47S.29S.1S

M E M O R A N D A

A v erag e  o f  to ta l  d eposits  fo r  th e  IS  c s le a d a r  d ay s  en d in g
w ith  c a ll d a te  ____________________ _______ ________. . . . . .

A v e rag e  o f  to ta l  lo a n s  f o r  th e  16 e a lm d a r  d a y ,  en d in g
w ith  e a ll  d a te  . . . . . . . . . . -------- . . . __. . . . . . . . _____________

L o a n , a s  sh o w n  in  item  7 o f  “ A aaets”  a r e  a f t e r  d educ tion
o f v a lu a tio n  re se rv es  o f  -----------------------------------------------------------  J.06S,297.28

S ec u ritie s  aa show n  in  i te m , 2-6 o f  “ A ss e ts "  a r e  a f t e r  d educ tion
o f  v a lu a tio n  rese rv ea  o f   -------------------------------------------------------  1.067.*68.SO

____  2.261.000.00

____  8.224,000.00

I , W illa rd  H u d so n , V ice P re s id e n t o f  th e  above-nam ed  b a n k , do  so lem n ly  
•w e a r  t h a t  th i s  r e p o r t  o f  co n d itio n  is t r u e  a n d  c o rre c t, to  th a  bea t a t  m y  
k now ledge a n d  belief.

W IL L A R D  H U D S O N
C o rre c t— A tte s t :

W . C A R R O L L  K N O R P P  
W A L T E R  B. K N O R P P
W E S L E Y  P . K N O R P P  D irec to r*

S ta te  e f  T e x a s , C oun ty  o f  D onley , s s :

S w o rn  to  a n d  subsc ribed  b e fo re  m e th is  17th  day  o f  O c to b e r, 1967. a n d  I
h ereby  c e r t i fy  t h a t  1 am  n o t a a  o ff ic e r  o r  d ire c to r  o f  th i s  b a n k .

S E A L
M y com m iaekm  e x p ire s  J a n e  1. 1*49 -

B A R B A R A  C O S P E R  
N o ta ry  P u b lic

i
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John McCauley of Memphis added spice to the Hedley 
Cotton Festival parade with his mule drawn covered 
wagon. (Leader Photo & Engraving)

BULLDOG KENNEL

___

Comments From The 
Coach's Corner

The open- house scrimmage of 
the Clarendon College Bulldogs 
held Tuesday night in the high 
school gym, was viewed by a 
large number of fans. The Bull­
dogs showed pre-season jitters, 
which caused a number of errors 
and lack of balance in attack. 
But at times, they gave fans a 
glimpse of aggressive perform­
ance.

Veteran sophomore Harry Can­
non took up where he left off 
last year, giving a fluid perform­
ance. Roy Holloway showed good 
form. The two post men, Chris 
Peacock and Tom Byrd, played 
well all night. Chris showed 
fine shooting talent, hitting all 
over the floor. Willie Clark and 
Mike Inman, back-up post men, 
provided some rough and tough 
competition.

rera, both recovering from sum­
mer surgery, were not in peal^ 
condition, but they are coming 
along well and will be ready 
when the season gets here. 
Claude Maldonado will give a 
more consistent performance un­
der pressure.

Jackie Baker proved to be a 
cool back-court man, which is a 
new position for him. He has 
previously played post. Rob Hol­
loway showed brilliance at times

with his agility and speed. Terry, 
Clarke, as usual, was constantly 
hustling, ready to do battle from 
the starting whistle. John Howell 
is coming along well and, with 
time, should prove to be an ex­
cellent player.

BAPTIST YOUTH RALLY AT 
ESTELLINE OCTOBER 23

The Panhandle Baptist Asso- 
ciational Youth Rallv will be held 
at the First Baptist Church in Es- 
telline Monday, October 23, at 
7:30 p.m. The Executive Com­
mittee will meet at 7 p.m. to 
plan future rallies.

Guest for the Monday meeting 
will be Alicia Galloway of Earth, 
Texas, a sophomore at Wayland 
Baptist College. She has served 
as an Invincible Summer Mis 
sionary for the past two sum­
mers in and around her associa­
tion, is a member of the Inter­
national Choir and Delta Chi 
Delta Social Club. She will share 
some of her experiences.

TEXAS TECH SATURDAY 
GAME IN FLORIDA

The Red Raiders of Texas Tech 
will challenge the Florida State 
Seminoles at Tallahassee Satur­
day afternoon, October 21. Game 
time is 2 p.m.

The Texas A & M Aggies 
eaked out a 24-14 win over th e , 

Rick Vidaurri and Mike Bar- Raiders in last Saturday's game
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IMPROVE THE QUALITY 
IN COTTON HARVEST

From a quality standpoint, the 
basic objective in cotton harvest­
ing is to keep moisture and trash 
content to a minimum, according 
to County Agent Ronald Gooch.

Their removal at the gin cre­
ates a major quality preservation 
problem. Excessive moisture and 
the presence of green leaves also 
cause quality losses in storage.

The moisture and trash con­
tent factor in seed cotton is re­
lated to prevailing weather, plant 
condition, and machine adjust­
ment and operation.

Important guidelines to con­
sider, according to Gooch are:

1. Moisture of seed cotton in 
the field should be about 10 per 
cent or less.

2. Machines must be condition­
ed prior to harvesting and kept 
in adjustment as dictated by 
plant and field conditions.

3. Operators must be trained 
and supervised.

4. A specific service program 
should be followed.

5. Excess lubrication should be 
removed.

6. Seed cotton of varying trash 
and moisture content should not 
be mixed in the same trailer.

7. Keep the cotton loose, clean 
and dry.

CARDS OF, 
THANKS

Our heartfelt thanks to all who I 
extended comforting sympathy | 
and help in our recent sorrow. 
For the beautiful service, floral I 
offerings, and other kindnesses,! 
we are deeply grateful.

Mrs. Odell Wallace & family I 
Mr. & Mrs. Delbert Robertson | 

& children
The W. A. Poovey family

To Late To Classify:

FOR SALE—3 Bedroom Modern I 
House with 4 acres of Land. | 
$6,000. Phone 874-3622 after 5 
p.m. Clyde Gilbreth. (39-tfc) |

m the final seconds of play. It 
was the Aggies’ first-win of the 
season .

Tech will play in Jones Sta­
dium, Lubbock, November 4 
which will also be the Homecom­
ing game. Their October 28th 
game will be in Dallas when 
they meet SMU.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Helton of 
Amarillo visited his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. H. Helton, Sunday.

FOR SALE
Small groc try and meat market 
located in colored and Mexican 
part of town. All cash store. Do 
tag good business. Low rent. Wall 
equipped 30 ft. Refrldgerstor 
Counter. A high profit store. No 
competition. Located close to 
new housing complex that will 
house 86 families.
607 E. Bedford Dimmitt, Texas

T h e re ’s  m o re  to  W id e -T ra c k in g

in  a  ’6 8  P o n tia c  

th a n  m e e ts  th e  eye .

*
Wide-Tracking is performance.
Wide-Tracking is handling.
Wide-Tracking is security.
Wide-Tracking is one of the great American sports.

Driving a new LeMans may be even more 
satisfying than looking at one. The stan­
dard engine is an Overhead Cam that 
delivers 175 hp from regular gas. You can 
order a 215-hp high-compression version.

Or go up to 265- or 320-hp V-8s. 
See your Pontiac dealer for a 
test drive and learn the differ­
ence between Wide-Tracking 
and plain ordinary driving, p*,**.

CHAMBERLAIN MOTOR CO.
HIGHWAY 287 — CLARENDON. TEXAS

Wilson’s Bar-B-Que
Beef Burgers

10c Each or 12 for $1.00
BUY THEM BY THE SACKFULL

TAMALES
ELLIS — No. 300 Can

4 For 9 8 c
PORK & BEANS 2 For
VAN CAMPS — No. 300 Can 29c
BUTTERSCOTCH

BROWNIE MIX
BETTY CROCKER — 16 Oi. Box

3 For $ 1 0 0

3LE COUPON

REGULAR S IZE

WIMesBWLBSDaiSVB
21c With Coupon

Without Coupon 33c 
Good Waek Of Oct. 19 Thru 25 

Good At Cliffords' Gro.

VIENNA SAUSAGE
WILSON'S ......................................

J VALUABLE COUPON

5 Cans
PRODUCE

COLORADO RED ROME

APPLES
2 Lbs. 25c
CALIF. THOMPSON SEEDLESS

GRAPES 
Lb. 19*
GREEN BELL

PEPPERS 
Lb. 15*
TEXAS YELLOW

ONIONS
2 Lbs. 15*
COLORADO RED McCLURE

POTATOES 
10 Lb. 39*

CRISCO 3 Lb. Can
PURE VEGETABLE SHORTENING # |

Gold Medal 25 Lb. Bag $ 1 8 9 1
FLOUR 5 Lb. Bag 4 9 *
BISCUITS 13 For $ 1 0 0 1

SweetmilkSHURFRESH — Buttermilk or

0LE0
PARKAY — Pure Vegetable

4 Lbs. $ J 0 0
DOG FOOD
ROXEY — Tall Cana

13 Cans $ 1 0 0

Fritos Corn Chips

Reg. 49c Pkg. ^

FRUIT DRINKS
WAGNER'S — Quart Bottles 3For799
ICE MILK
FAIRMONT DAIRY FAIR

lA Gallon 4 g £
MIXED VEGETABLES 5 Cans $ 1 0 0
VEG ALL — 303 Cans A
NEW PUNCH
LAUNDRY DETERGENT

Giant Size 599
TOMATO SOUP
CAMPBELL'S .........................

4 For 49*
PRUNE JUICE
DEL MONTE — Quart Bottla 459
VEIVEETA
CHEESE ..............

2 Lb. Box 989
PANCAKE MIX 2Lb.Boi
AUNT JEMIMA—Free Bottla of Syrup With Each Box 45*
CHILI
ELLIS — Without Beans

15 Oz. Can 399
Dream Whip 
DESSERT TOPPING

4 Oz. Box 399 
8 Oz. Box 699

BUTTERMILK % Gal l O c
FAIRMONT ........................................................................... $100TOWELS
KLEENEX — Jumbo Rolls

3 For

PEACHES 3 Cans
Dal Monte Yellow Cling, Sli. or Halves, No. 2V* Cana . . . . 899

C H O I C E
MEATS

WILSON CERTIFIED Thick or Thin

BACON
2 Lb. Pkg. $ 1 1 9
(Best Money Can Buy)
WILSON CERTIFIED

FRANKS 
Lb.
Vacuum Pak__________
WRIGHT'S WRAPPED

PICNIC HAMS 
Lb.
6-8 Lb. Average 
USD A GRADE "A"

FRYERS 
Lb.
Extra Fancy

539

379

299
USDA GOOD

SIRLOIN STEAK 
Lb.
Cut Am You Lika Them 799

Always Fraah C LIFF O R D S’
GROCERY & MARKET

CLARENDON. TEXAS 
MEMBER AFFILIATED FOOD STORES

Use Our
New Parking Area 

While Shopping 
In Our Stora



/
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CLASSIFIED AD;
All ad* are Cash with order, unless customer 
Isas an established account with The Donley County Leader. Billing Charges will be add­ed on accounts under $5.00.

CLASSIFIED AD RATES
MINIMUM CHARGE ..'.................................................. 60c
PER WORD, FIRST INSERTION ................................ 5c
PER WORD, FOLLOWING INSERTIONS.................. 4c

FOR RENT
BOOM AND HOARD — Reason­
able, also trailer park. Mri. Ruby
Bromley. Phone 2186. (7-tfc)

USED TV SETS FOR RENT. In­
quire a t Henson's. (38-tfc)

RENT TYPEWRITERS 
at the

Donley County Loader 
Phone 874-2043

SIGNS FOR ALL NEEDS 
at the

Donley County Leader 
Phone 874-2043

FOR RENT — One Bedroom fur- 
atahed apartment. Phone 874- 
SS44, C. W. Bennett. (44-tfc)
FOR RENT--2 Bedroom House, 

874-3844, Tommie Saye.
(8-tfc)

FOR RENT — 4 room house, 2 
ear garage and store rooms. Con­
tact Ray Palmer at Palmer Motor 
C ol (33-tfc)
FOR RENT—one downstairs and 

upatairs 2 bedroom apart- 
nts. See lady in house back of 

Apia, or phone 874-2473. (34-tfc)

ADDING MACHINE RIBPONS 
FOR ALL TYPES OF 
ADDING MACHINES 

Fresh Stock 
Donley County LeadeT 

Phone 874-2043
FOR SALE — 80 acres good graz­
ing land, new windmill well, 2 
miles south of town. Call Bud 
Moore. Phone 874-3687. (13-tfc)
Identity Your Boat with Regula­
tion LaMars end Numbers. Du­
pont Mylar. Meet U. S. Coast 
Guard Specifications. Now avail­
able at Donley County Leader.
KEYS MADE AT TUNNELL 
PHARMACY, Brass and Colored.

(24-15c)
FOR SALE — 3 Bedroom Home, 
Bath and a half; 717 W. 8th. Dick 
Vallance. (35-tfc)

Typewriter and Adding Machine 
Ribbons, Adding Machine Tape, 
All sizes at the Donley County 
Leader office.

ROY M. HORN
Typewriting and Adding Machine 
repair service. Wellington, Texas. 
Call Donley County Leader office 
regarding any kind of repair ser­
vice, 874-2043. (13-tfc)
Let John Broadstreet repair and 
refinish furniture, sharpen hand 
saws and saw blades. Pick up 
and delivery. 6th & Carhart St.,
Phone 874-2198. (37-tfc)
NO TRESPASSING on F. J. 
Hommel land. All violators will 
be prosecuted. (35-tfc)
NO TRESPASSING, HUNTING, 
FISHING, OR SAND BUGGIES 
on any of my places or leases. 
William M. Porter. (36-tfc)
Before you arrange to finance 
your new or late model car, com­
pare my naw low cost finance 
rate*. I can save you money. Em 
mett O. Simmons at the Farmers 
State Bank.
A1 Babiash Interior - Exterior 
Decorating, Also neon and sign 
painting. Business 4 blocks south 
of Mrs. Bromley’s. Thank You

(39-p)

WANTED
WANTED — To buy used cars 
and used furniture. City Cafe, 
Phone 874-2328. (17-tfc)

FOR RENT — 1 Bedroom fur­
nished apartment across Highway 
from Bell Station. Call 874-2439, 
Mrs. Henry Tatum. (37-tfc)

2 Bedroom Home for Sale at 1001 
West 7th. Sprinkler System, 
Evergreens, 2 Car Garage. Close 
to schools. C. W. Bennett, Phone 
875-3524. (35-tfc)

FOR RENT — Furnished Apart­
ment, carpeted, TV connections, 
private bath. Adults only. Block­
er Apartments. (39-tfc)
FOR RENT — Furnished Apart­
ment, private bath. Mrs. Estal 
Clark, 216 E. 4th. (39-tfc)

FOR SALE — Good used Allis- 
Chalmers 66 PTO Combines. New 
72 Allis-Chalmers PTO Com­
bines. Good stock of PTO Allis- 
Chalmers combine parts. Phone 
806-874-2356, ESTLACK MA­
CHINERY COMPANY, CLAR­
ENDON, TEXAS. (35-tfc)

FOR SALE
FOR SALE — Red and yellow 
Del. Apiples and other varieties 
m  miles south of Alanreed on 
FM Road 291. W. O. Hommel.

(33-tfc)
FARM & RANCH Bookkeeping 

now available at the 
office. Also General 

Bookkeeping systems. Govern- 
app roved.

For Sale. See Bill Wea­
therly at Foxworth-Galbraith 
Lumber Company. (28-tfc)

LOSE WEIGHT safely with Dex- 
A-Diet Tablets. Only 98c at Tun- 
nell Pharmacy (43-p)
FOR SALE — 21 International 
Boll Puller, top shape, ready to 
go, at a reasonable price. W. D 
Higgins, Rt. 1, Clarendon. (39-p)

Stanley Home Products needs 
extra help for Christmas & Fall 
business, 4 hours daily, $50 week­
ly. For interview, write or Call 
Collect Loreta Watters, MO 4- 
2965, 1307 Duncan, Pampa, Texas

(38-4c)

LOST & FOUND
REWARD — Lost Billfold. Keep 
money and return billfold and 
papers to the Leader Office or 
Phone 874-2372. Chas. G. Speed.

(39-2c)

Thursday night and visited with 
his mother, Mrs. Rosie Watson.

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Reid, Pete 
Land, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. Gres­
ham, and Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Pittman of Stratford were vis­
itors last week in the W. D. 
Higgins home.

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Land vis­
ited Sunday in South Plains with 
Mr. and Mrs. Arby Mulder.

Chris Schollenbarger went to 
Amarillo Saturday with his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Geo. 
Schollenbarger.

Mrs. Ruby Blackman and Mrs 
Melba Risley went to Pampa 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. George Schollen­
barger were supper guests Sat­
urday night of Mr. and Mrs Keith

Floats in the Hedley Cotton Festival Parade Saturday 
included: top—Miss Nancy Saunders on the Stafford Gro­
cery foat and lower, Miss Annette Johnson on the Sodo- 
litas Club float.

MARTIN NEWS
Mrs. Raymond Waldrop

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Renfro 
of Cleveland, Tenn. visited a week 
with her brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
W. D. Higgins.

Mrs. Faylon Watson, and Mrs. 
W. W. Ashcraft went to Lubbock 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Hadder, Mr. 
and Mrs. L. L. Waldrop, and Mar­
garet Waldrop shopped in Amar­
illo Tuesday.

Have One good Black Angus 
Bull for Sale or Trade for slight­
ly larger Bull or would pasture 
your Bull for Service. Jim But­
ler, Phone 874-3732. (39-p)

DON'T TAKE OLD FINISH OFF 
your cabinets, furniture. Refinish 
in woodgrain or antique with 
Old Masters. Easy. Just paint it 
on. J  & W Lumber and Supply.

(47-tfc)
M il.1.IONS of rugs have been 
cleaned with Blue Lustre. It’s 
America’s finest. Rent electric 
stiampooer $1. Goodman Furni­
ture.
FOR SALE — Youngster's Golf 
Clubs with Bag and Cart. Jim 
Butler, Phone 874-3732. (39-p)
FOR SALE — 1 Model 66 AC 
Combine; 1 Model 21 Interna­
tional Cotton Stripper with Farm 
Hand Trailer Loader. Call or see 
J. L. Butler, 1 mile south of Leila 
Lake, Phone 84-2127. (39-p)
FOR SALE — 2 Lots, 2 Bedroom 
House, garage in Claude. Call 

►-4831 or see A. L. Suttles.
(40-p)

REAL ESTATE
Houses. Lota And 
Farms For Sala

JOHN GARNER
R E A L  ESTATE

Phone 874-2330 
tJlarandon. Texas

J W
BUTANE
PROPANE

m̂iduu 
uthett qsa tee 

tto EinUem
T  at M OIL COMPANY 

Phona 874-2155

International Baler (Hay) For 
Sale; Cheap. Dick (Alvie) May- 
field, Silverton, Texas. (39-2c)
FOR SALE — 1964 Sears Mo-Ped 
Motor Bike. Just completely 
overhauled and in top shape. 
Contact Owner at 721 West 6th 
St. or Phone 874-2382. (39-3c)

HALE TRAILERS
FOR SALE OR TRADE 
A Complete Line Of 

STOCK & HORSE TRAILERS 
For Free Estimate Call 

HENSON'S
Phone 874-3823 — Clarendon

FOR SALE — 4 Cotton Trailers; 
one 4-Row Godevil with attach­
ments with 3 point hitch; one 16 
John Deere Cotton Puller; one 
4-Row Cultivator with 3 point 
hitch. D. E. Leathers, Phone 874- 
2092. (40-p)
CHOICE LOTS 
new College. 
Phone 874-2330.

for Sale near 
John Garner, 

(39-20
Rogers' Bargain Store is expand­
ing. Twice as much space, twice 
as many items, twice as many 
Bargains. Come and See. Sale is 
still on. (39-p)
For Sale — Black Miniature Reg. 
Poodle Puppies. Write COS­
TELLO, 2319, Larry, Amarillo 
79106. Phone FL 5-6923. (40-p)

MISCELLANEOUS
FREE P.EMOVAL of dead stock. 
Call Clarendon Veterinary Clinic 
874-3680 or DR 9-2211 Collect, 
Amarillo Rendering Co. (45-tfc)
See Johnnie Bates for your Trash 
hauling.

FOR ANY OCCASION 
Photographs 

Portraits 
Waddings 

Family Groups Or 
Commsrcial

Black 8c White Or Color 
Call

SAYE’S STUDIO
Phona 874-3844

C O N T R A C TO R S' N O T IC E  O F 
T E X A S  H IG H W A Y  

C O N ST R U C TIO N  
Sealed proposals for constructing 
Junkyard Screening

Located at 11.64 Miles North 
of US 62, 11.74 Miles North 
of US 62, 11.82 Miles North 
of US 62, 13.74 Miles South­
east of Armstrong County 
Line, 9.36 Miles Northwest of 
Hall County Line, 15.21 Miles 
West of Childress County 
Line, 0.78 Mile West of US 83 
and 0.45 Mile West of US 83 

on Highway No. US 83, US 287 & 
US. 66, covered by CJF OOOE 
(12) in Collingsworth, Donley, 
Hall & Wheeler County, will be 
received at the Highway Depart­
ment, Austin, until 9:00 A.M., 
November C, 1967, then publicly 
opened and read.

The State Highway Depart­
ment, in accordance with the pro­
visions of Title VI of the Civil 
Rights Act of 1964 (78 Stat. 252) 
and the Regulations of the De­
partment of Commerce (15 C.F.R., 
Part 8), issued pursuant to such 
Act, hereby notifies all bidders 
that it will affirmatively insure 
that the contract entered into 
pursuant to this advertisement 
will be awarded to the lowest re­
sponsible bidder wihout discrim­
ination on the grounds of race, 
color, or national origin.

Plans and specifications in­
cluding minimum wage rates as 
provided by Law are available 
at the office of William T. col­
lier, Resident Engineer, Chil­
dress, Texas, and Texas High­
way Department, Austin. Usual 
rights reserved. (39-2c)

DR. JACK L. ROSE
OPTOMETRIST
Phone 259-2216

415-A Main Memphis

LEADER CLASSIFIEDS 
GET RESULTS

R A Y 'S  A P P L IA N C E  
SE R V IC E  

General Electric
Franchise Dealer For 

Heating it Air Conditioning 
Sales 8c Service

JOE
GOLDSTON
O p to m e tris t 
Office Hours 
8-12—2-» 
CaU for

A p p o in tm e n t

MRS. TRUETT HALL

INCOME TAX SERVICE 
BOOKKEEPING

Located East of 

Court House Square

C L A R E N D O N . TEXAS

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Land at­
tended the Cotton Festival in 
Hedley Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Renfro 
of Cleveland, Tenn., Mr. and Mrs 
Clyde Pittman of Stratford, B. 
H. Higgins, Larry, Paula, and 
David of Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. 
W. D. Higgins, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Cole and children were din­
ner guests Sunday of Mrs. Mar­
garet Waldrop and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Lyles and 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Blackman went 
to the Canadian-Clarendon Foot­
ball game at Canadian Friday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Hill of Amar­
illo spent Thursday with Mr. and 
Mrs. L. L. Waldrop.

Mr. and Mrs. Mickey Thomas 
of Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Hearn of Lawton, Okla. 
spent the week end with Mr. 
and Mrs. Charlie Hearn. Bro 
Bryan Knowles was a dinner 
guest Sunday.

Eleene Jackson is still in the 
hospital but is improving.

Chester Talley got his hand 
injured working on a combine 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. L. A. Watson at­
tended a football game in Groom

Schollenbarger.
Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Jordan and 

their daughter, Geraldine of Cal- 
iforina visited Monday afternoon 
with Mrs. L. O. Christie.

Mr. and Mrs. James Able of 
Borger visited Friday with Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarence Reynolds.

Mrs. Jackson, Mrs. Sallie Kel­
ler, and Mrs. James Able visited 
Friday with Eleene Jackson in 
Adair HospitaL

Bro. Bryan Knowles was a din­
ner guest Saturday of Mr. and 
Mrs. Clarence Reynolds.

Martin Quilting Club will meet 
October 26 at the club room. 
Bring a sack lunch.

QUALITY JOB PRINTING 
AT THE LEADER

CHICKEN
AS YOU LIKE IT!

DRUMSTICK DINING 
IS AS SIMPLE A S -

VARIETY.mOder lust whit you ID
• ALL WHITE HUT
• ALL DARK MEAT
•  MIXED LI6HT11
• ALL LIVER ORDER
• AIL SIZ2ARD ODDER
• ALL THISH ORDER
•  ALL DRUMSTICKS

PRICE...

4 full order of chi 
Is just

(We’re featured the sane low 
since 1950

C0NVENIENCK

eat R  here or taka It out! Try a *  
convenient take out department!

THE 6MCQT U7TLE Rk'UtOkDIWALL ThT iJ ^

DRUMSTIC
2 7 0 0  G E O R G IA

ForTAKE OUT ORDERS call FL.5-5656

C O N N I E ’S
RADIO AND TV SERVICE 
Ww Service All Makes 

And Models
Home

Auto
Television 

PHONE 874-3752
Next Door To Fire Station

FOR SALE

2 Story, 20 Room Apt. Building.
Reduced to $4,000. Can Be 

Bought On Monthly Payments 
Like Rent.

GEORGE O. HAMLIN 
212 N. Houston-Phone MO 4-8824 

Pampa, Taxaa (42-p)

Service All Makes
Air Conditioning

Freeser 8t Refrigeration 
Service it Repairs

PHONE 874-3801 
CLARENDON, TEXAS 
D. P. RAY. OWNER

TV Cable Service
THREE

CLEAR CHANNELS 
plus FM Music and 

Continuous Weather Scan 
On Channel 6 

For Information and 
Service CaU 874-3570

CABLE TV
OF CLARENDON

Fall Tune-up Special
4-Cylinder
Engines
6-Cylinder
Engines
8-Cylinder
Engines

*10
* n

88

N

NEW CHAMPION PLUGS, 
POINTS AND CONDENSER

This Low Price 
Include*
•  Adjust Points

•  Set Timing

•  Adjust Carbureator

•  We Road Teat For Performance

•  Expert Installation

LEEK’S BELL STATION GARAGE
417 EAST 2ND PHONE 874-9882
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CHAMBERLAIN
NEWS

Mr*. A. O. Hot!

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Gilbreth 
and Doyle Wayne spent Friday 
night in Canadian with her bro­
ther, Mr. and Mrs. Troy Newton.

E. W. Barbee visited Mr. and 
Mm . A. O. Hott Monday afternon.

Mr. and Mrs. C. A. Wright at­
tended the football game in 
Memphis Friday night and vis­
ited her mother, • Mrs. Stella 
Jones.

Mm . James came home with 
them for a visit

Mr. and Mm . Frank Hardin 
went to Amarillo Wednesday for 
a checkup. He is still improv­
ing.

Mr. and Mm . A. 0. Hott visited 
Mr. and Mm . W. O. Elliott Tues­

day afternoon.
Those visiting Mr. and Mm 

Frank Hardin during the week 
were Glen Williams, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. B. Ivey, Mr. and Mrs. 
Roy Blackman, Clarence Ayers, 
Mr. and Mrs. R. R. Dingier and 
Mrs. P. C. Logan.

John Sommers spent the week 
end in Memphis with friends.

Mr. and Mm . L. H. Price vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs. A. O. Hott 
Saturday night.

Mm . D. G. Ballew, Miss Ruth 
Corbin, Mrs. Richard Dingier, 
and Mrs. A. B. Ivey enjoyed the 
Hedley Cotton Festival Saturday.

Mr, and Mrs. A. O. Hott at­
tended the Festival Saturday.

Mrs. Jess Ivey has returned 
home after visiting her children 
in Amarillo.

Mr. and Mm. Dennis Harrison 
and Anna visited Mr. and Mm . 
Tommy Beck Friday evening.

Mm . Lora Springer of Amarillo 
visited her sister, Mr. and Mrs.

F R O N T -  LO A D I N G  P O R T A B L E  
« ^ * * * i ^ -  D I S H W A S H E R

Self-deaning 
filter plus

S u j D & r *

Modal SRC-80
soteb wash for ertra-dirty dishes • Two full-size revolving 
spray arms • Self-cleaning filter • “Blindfold" random­
loading racks • Dual detergent dispensers • Big capacity 
for once-a-day dishwashing.

HOUSEHOLD SUPPLY CO.
COMPLETE HOME FURNISHINGS

"W» Service and Repair Anything We Sell"
HOME OWNED and OPERATED

16TH ANNUAL HEDLEY COTTON FESTIVAL PARADE!—Left to right, Miss Tanya White on Greenbelt Electric Cooperative float; Miss Pat 
George on the Hedley Beauty Shop float; and Clarendon Riding Club.

Henry Mann Sunday afternoon.
Mm. Richard Dingier and Mrs. 

D. G. Ballew attended a Sunday 
School social at Mrs. Clyde Wil­
son’s ThuMday night.

Mr. and Mrs. A. O. Hott and 
Mr. and Mrs. L. H. Price attended 
the tea for Mr. and Mrs. U. J. 
Boston of Amarillo, held at the 
Robert C. Jones home Sunday af­
ternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. R. R. Dingier 
visited his daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Cowan and children at Tulia 
Friday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Harrison 
and Anna visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Theron Holland and family Sun­
day.

Mrs. Lena Springer of Amarillo 
ate lunch Sunday with her sis­
ter, Mr. and Mrs. R. R. Dingier.

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Jones, Mike 
and Karen of Dalhart visited her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. H. A. 
Harrison Thursday. They were 
on their way to Navasota to visit 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Cannon and family.

Mrs. Morris Crump and son, 
Ray, and Mr. and Mrs. A. B. 
Ivey visited relatives in Pampa 
Sunday.

C. T. Bates attended the Hed­
ley Cotton Festival Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Tribble 
and son, Bob, of Memphis vis­
ited her brother, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Gilbreth and Doyle Wayne 
Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Lindley 
and boys visited Mr. and Mrs.

Morris Crump and Ray Tuesday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Washington 
and girls of Amarillo visited her 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. E. W. Bar­
bee and family Sunday.

ASHTOLA NEWS
Mrs. H ubert Rhoades

Only Six
New ‘67 Model 
LeSabre Biiicks

L e ft
All Are 4-Door Sedans

We Need
Your Good, Clean 

Trade-In
We Are Low On Good, Clean U*ed 

Automobiles And Need Yours NOW!

CHAMBERLAIN MOTOR 00.
Cadillac_Bulck — Oldsmobile — Pontiac — Opal — GMC Trucks

Mrs, J. C. Taylor of Filmore, 
Calif, is visiting the C. M. Cor- 
bells and others.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Turner 
and Brenda of Amarillo and 
Karen, all of Clarendon, spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. J. B. 
Lane.

Mrs. Van Knox and Mrs. A. 
H. Moore were co-hostesses for 
the Mary Martha class party 
Tuesday.

Mrs. Della Mahaffey and Mrs. 
Edith Longan of Clarendon have 
been house guests of Mr. tnd 
Mrs. H. S. Mahaffey.

Burnice Porter of Lubbock 
spent the week end with the Hor­
ace Greens.

Mr. and Mrs. T. B. Odom have 
returned from a trip to Dallas 
and vicinity.

Harold Green of Borger visit­
ed Saturday with Mrs. Walter 
Green in Clarendon and the Hu­
bert Rhoades.

H. S. Mahaffey and Hubert 
Rhoades attended the Couch Auc­
tion Sale at Hedley Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Parker 
of Clarendon spent Sunday night 
with Mr .and Mrs. L. M. Porter.

Mr. and Mrs. H. S. Mahaffey 
made a business trip to Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Nuford Dill and 
Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Carter spent 
the week end in Ada, Okla. with 
Neel Carter.

B. F. DeBord visited W. H. De- 
Bord in Groom Hospital Sunday.

Mrs. Van Knox and Mrs. A. H. 
Moore shopped in Pampa Fri/tay.

Mrs. Mary Bell DeBord has re­
turned from an extended visit 
with her daughter and family in 
Burley, Idaho and getting ac­
quainted with the two grand­
daughters. While there she vis­
ited with the H. A. Harrisons 
and the Sam McAnears. In Twin 
Falls she visited a brother and 
her mother, Mrs. Lilly and Mr. 
and Mrs. Floy Lilly. Mrs. Ray 
Gaskell, a cousin of Mary Belle, 
entertained her with a dinner in 
her home. Then they all spent a 
few days at Magic Lake where 
the Gaskells have a cabin.

HEDLEY NEWS
Mr*. M abel B ridget

Mr. rnd Mrs. Homer Simmons 
received a cable from their son, 
Frank, in Tokyo, Japan announ­
cing the arrival of a fine little 
daughter, Stepheny Elizabeth, 
born October 4, weight 8 lbs 7 oz. 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Simmons are 
at Tachikawa Air Force Base 
Congratulations!

Mrs. Margerite Nivens came

fine.
Arthus Barnes of Pampa stop­

ped for a short visit Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Grant Hartwell en- 
route home from Durant, Okla.

Hedley friends extend deepest 
sympathy to Mrs. Odell Wallace 
in the death of her husband.

Mrs. Bess Hemphill of Tow, 
Texas, Mrs. Mary Wooliner of 
Marlow, Okla., Mr. and Mrs. 
Chas. Grimsley and son of El 
Paso visited their brother, W. E. 
Grimsley and attended the Co­
tori Festival.

Mrs. Mollie Treet of Roswell, 
N. Mex. is spending a few days 
in Hedley. Pete Newman of Cou­
sins Home in Memphis spent 
some time with his sister.

Mrs. Myrtle Edwards and Miss 
Gladys Scales of Lubbock spent 
Sunday and Monday with their 
brother, Bill, and Mrs. Scales, 
pital is ill in Hall County Hos­
pital. Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Whisenant, Patrice and Rusty of 
Abilene spent the week end with 
their grandparents, the Scales.

Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Hartwell 
of Amarillo spent the week end 
with his parents, the Grant Hart­
wells.

Rev. Cecil Guthrie returned 
home from Lubbock hospital Sun­
day. He is doing fine and had a 
good report from his doctors, 
which his many friends were 
glad to know.

The Owens clan had their 
annual get together last week 
here and at Amarillo. Six of the

Mrs. George Owens, Mr. and Mrs. 
Buster Owens, all of Amarillo; 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Owens o f 
Odessa; and Tom Owens of 
Bernardino, Calif., who has been 
visiting several weeks. H e re­
turned home Sunday with th e  
Gus Owens.

Mrs. W. I. Rains is still a  pa­
tient in Hall County Hospital. 
Out-of-town visitors this week 
were Pete Bromley, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Land, of Clarendon; 
Zcb Land of Pampa; Mrs. Alice 
Wall, Mr. and Mrs. Rasco Land 
of Wellington; Mrs. Bess Hemp­
hill of Tow, Texas; Mrs. M ary 
Wooliner of Marlow, Okla.; the 
Bill Bridges of Am arillo; Mrs. 
Myrtle Edwards, Miss Gladys 
Scales of Lubbock.

Malcolm Glass was paid a short 
visit by his nephew, Joe Glass 
Jr., of Dallas, and two boys from 
Japan Friday.

Due to illness, I was unable to 
attend the Cotton Festival and 
do not have a full report, only a  
few highlights of the event.

77 Old Settlers registered Fri­
day. Mrs. Minnie Mann, age 86, 
was the oldest woman. Luther 
Petty was the oldest man, age 92. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gus Owens of G len­
dale, Calif, traveled t  he far- 
therest to attend. Mrs. W. I. 
Rains, age 87, who was ill, was the  
only living founder of this or­
ganization and was presented a 
lovely bouquet in her hospital 
room.

Congratulations to Miss la d y  
Leggitt, who was crowned <
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Mrs. Lena Mae Graham, Jo 
Horschler and Sue Rhoades at­
tended a Tri-Chem Painting class 
at Goodnight Community Center 
as guests of Mrs. A. J. Garland.

Mr. and Mrs. Van Knox made
a business trip to Amarillo.

Mrs. J. Gill, Charlotte and
Carol of Pampa and Mr. and
Mrs. Gene Brownlee of Hereford 
spent Sunday with Mr. and Mrs.
Frank Mahaffey and Hugh. Mrs.
John Just, Johnny and Ella Beth 
called in the afternoon.

John Butler and Annalea Ap- 
plin of Claude visited in Clar­
endon Sunday with Clyde Butler 
and with the Hubert Rhoades.

The Horace Green family at­
tended the football game in Can­
adian Friday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Mahaffey of 
Amarillo visited Friday night in 
the H. S. Mahaffey home. Della 
Mahaffey and Edith Longan of 
Clarendon went home with them 
for the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. John Just and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. T. A.
Nelson attended the Cotton Fes­
tival at Hedley Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Herald Yeager 
of Wellington visited Mr. and 
Mrs. C. C. Horschler Sunday af­
ternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. George Gresham 
had the Hightower boys of 
Groom with them Sunday.

T. A. Nelson Jr., of Phoenix,
Ariz. came Sunday night to spend 
a few days with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. T. A. Nelson, Sr. and 
sister, the John Justs of Lelia 
Lake.

Horace Green spent Saturday 
night with Rodney Green in 
Northwest Hospital in Amarillo.
Rodney is improving.

Edd Mahaffey of Amarillo 
brought Della Mahaffey and 
Edith Longan to Clarendon Sun­
day and ate lunch with the H. S 
Mahaffeys.

Mrs. Buddy Tiddle and Teri of 
Amarillo spent a few days with 
the Vance Grays. Mr. Tiddle came 
for them Saturday.

Visiting in the T. A. Nelson 
home Sunday afternoon were 
Mrs. John Just, Ella Beth and 
Johnny of Lelia Lake, Mr. and 
Mrs. Everett Waterson and Mrs 
Ray Waterson from Lubbock, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Caffee 
of Panhandle.

boys and some of their families pat M’ Hrst princess and 
enjoyed being together. Here for Debbie stephen second 
the occasion were Mr. and Mrs. 1

QUALITY JOB P R IN T IN G  
AT THE LEADER

WORKHORSE
TIRE F a m o u s  “ S u r e -  
G r ip ”  q u a lity  fo r  e x tr a  
t r a c t io n  o n  a n y  r o a d

$ f O 6 0
Blackwell
t lus Fed.

x. Tax & 
racappabla 
tire

S IZ E T Y P E F E D . E X . T A X

6.70x15 tube-type $2.83
7.00x13 tubeless $2.54
7.00x14 tubeless $2.76

' Extra deep tread for "GO" 
traction on dry or snow-covered 
roods

» Triple-tempered nylon cord 
construction—built to take truck 
work in stride

* Long-wearing Tu/syn rubber /or 
extra mileaga

B U Y  N O W  on 
our easy pay plan!

G O O D f Y E A R
H EN SO N ’SCLARENDON

TEXAS
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FARM  NEWS
I  County ABCS Committee

BOIL BANK AND 
CAP PAYMENTS

Most of these payments were 
mailed to producers last week. 
There are a few still pending pay­
m ent due to grazing, buying, or 
unsigned applications for pay­
ments. These will be made as 
soon as possible.
COTTON LOANS

Again this year, cotton loans 
will be made by the county of­
fice or by an approved loan 
clerk.

Only two clerks outside the 
county office are approved to 
prepare the cotton loans this 
year—Carl Bennett and Homer 
Estlack. You may bring your 
warehouse receipts and class 
cards here to the office or to ei­
ther of these men. However, all 
loans will be disbursed by the 
county office and records main­
tained here.
N H  FARM PROGRAMS

We have not yet received any 
information on the 1968 cotton, 
feed, or CAP programs. We will 
notify you as quickly as possible 
after this information is received. 
ISM WHEAT YIELD
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These are some of the Amarillo Model A Club cars which 
took part in the Hedley Cotton Festival Parade Satur­
day. The crowd was beginning to gather early for the 
big event Saturday. (Leader Photo & Engraving)_______

Donley County received a re­
duction in the projected yield. 
Your projected yield for 1968 will 
be from 2 to 3 bushels lower 
than the 1967 yield.

Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Goar of 
Houston and Mr. and Mrs. Ca»l 
Schmidt and daughter. Joyce, of 
Dallas visited from Monday to 
Wednesday with their uncle, G. 
A. Anderson.

VISITS IN OKLAHOMA
Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Carter of 

Clarendon, Mr. and Mrs. Nuford 
Dill of Asntola, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leon Carter and Mike of Sher­
man, Mr. and Mrs. Chester Car­
ter and Mr. and Mrs. Bob Carter 
of Bells, Texas, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Carter of Fort Worth ga­
thered at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Neel Carter and children 
in Ada, Oklahoma for the week 
end. All reported a good time.

Miss Linda Dickson rides high in the Cotton Festival 
Parade Saturday. This was the General Telephone Co. 
entry in the parade. (Leader Photo & Engraving)_____

MOTHER DIES IN 
DALLAS WEDNESDAY

Mrs. Jewell Quisenberry of 
Amarillo, mother of Mrs. James 
Allen of Pampa and formerly of 
Clarendon, died in a Dallas hos­
pital Wednesday. Funeral ser­
vices and burial were in Amar­
illo Saturday.

Surviving are her husband, two 
sons, three daughters, three 
brothers one of which is Virgil 
McPherson of Hedley, four sis­
ters, and six grandchildren.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Bailey of 
El Monte, Calif, are spending a 
few days in the home of her 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Jones, 
Sr. Another sister, Rev. and Mrs. 
M. O. Evans of Piainview are 
also spending a few days. Mr. 
Evans is a brother of Mrs. Jones 
and Mrs. J. B. Smith.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Blocker, 
Jr. and Shelley Miller of Here­
ford visited Sunday with Mrs. 
J. F. Blocker.

WEST TEXAS STATE BUFFS 
ON THE ROAD THIS WEEK

The West Texas State Univer­
sity Buffaloes are on the road this 
week playing New Mexico State
at Las Cruces, N. Mex. Game time 
is 7:30 p.m. Mountain Standard 
Time.

The Buffs overpowered the 
Spartans of San Jose, Calif, by 
a score of 28-14 in their game at 
Buffalo Bowl Saturday night of 
last week. The Buffs held a 28-0 
lead at the beginning of the 4th 
quarter. Two of their scores came 
on fumbles behind the San Jose 
goal line. The Spartans came back 
to score two TDs and threaten 
several times in the fourth period 
of play. Neither team was at 
their best for the game.

The Buffs will again see action 
on home ground when they meet 
Arlington State at 7:30 p.m. Octo­
ber 28. A capacity crowd is ex­
pected for Homecoming game 
which will be the last home game 
for the Buffaloes. They will have 
three more games on the road 
before the season closes.

Mrs. U. T. Dever of Lubbock, 
Mrs. Uva Dever and Mrs. Clyde 
Gilbert called on Mrs. Edith Lon- 
gan and Mrs. Della Mahaffey 
Tuesday.

Mrs. Rex Jones is visiting in 
Dallas.

NEW SOCIAL STUDIES 
INSTRUCTOR AT COLLEGE

Mr. Steve Carter has joined the 
faculty at Clarendon College as 
a part-time instructor in Social 
Studies. A native of Tennessee, 
he is currently living in Amarillo 
and commuting to Clarendon 
twice each week.

Mr. Carter is a graduate of 
Palo Duro High School in Am­
arillo, and earned his Bachelor 
of Arts at the University of 
Texas. He has previously taught 
as a graduate assistant in the 
English D eparting  at West 
Texas State University where he 
is completing work on his Mas­
ter of Arts. , N T

Mrs. Della Mahaffey of Sants 
Ana, Calif, is speeding this week 
with Mrs. Edith Loogan.
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Cash Prices Save You Money Every Day At Super Save Market Gunn Bros. Stamps—Ph. 874-3546—We Deliver
TOILET TISSUE lORoUPkg. L Q ^ POPCORN 2 For X Q g

JOLLY TIME — 10 Ox. Can. White or Yellow . . .  W  »  Y
COOKIES 3
JOHNSON'S ASS T CREMES

Pkgs $ JOO

PINTO BEANS 4 Lb. Bag C O *
C L E A N E D  & R E C L E A N E D  — New Crop

PORK & BEANS 7
V A N  CAMP — 300 Cana

For $l |0 0 AWAKE 9 Oz. Can
BIRDSEYE FROZEN

C R ISC O
SHORTENING 
3Lb.Can ...
With $5.00 Or More Purchase of Groceries

.59

COCONUT
DURKEES — 14 Ox. Pkg. 49c
CAKE MIX 3 For
DUNCAN HINES — All Layer ...........

KOTEX
REG. OR SUPER

2 Boxes

89c
69c

CO FFEE
.65

Maryland Club 
All Grinds -  Lb. Can

«• low bud««ft prices

BACON
WILSON'S CORN KING

2 Lb. Pkg. $ |1 9
FRYERS 1LB. 270
FRANKS 12 Oz. Pkg. \ Q *
B A R S

SAUSAGE 4
TOP-O-TEXAS

Lb. Sack $119
HOT BARBECUE DAILY

CRANBERRIES
OCEAN SPRAY — Lb. Pkg. 29c
POTATOES iO Lbs.
c o l o . r e d  McCl u r e s 39c
CABBACE
COLO. GREEN TABLE

Lb. 5$
TURNIPS 2 Lbs.
PURPLE TOP — White Globe 25c

Biscuits
WHITE SWAN 
Sweetmilk Or 
Buttsrmilk

13 Cans
$ |0 0

CORN MEAL
PETER PAN—White Or Yellow

5 Lb. Bag
TOWELS
NORTHERN—2 Roll Pkg.

3 For $ £ 0 0  j

BOLD Giant Size f% Q |£
See Our Display For Free Lady Schick Razor

PEANUT BUTTER
BIG TOP — 18 Or. Jar 49$

Flour GLADIOLA

5 Lb. Bag .49
CRACKERS
FIRESIDE

2 Lb. Box
PRESERVES
WHITE SWAN ASS T — 18 Oz. Tumblers

3 For $*109
TOMATO JUICE
LIBBY'S — 46 Oz. Can 2 For 69$
FRUIT COCKTAIL
HUNT'S — 300 Cans

4 For $ |  00

CREAM PIES
FROZEN — 9 Os.

Each 29C
AUSTEX CHIU 300 Size Can 49C
JERCEN’S LOTION 65c Size 49$
LISTERINE $1.15 Size 9 9 «
SWAN
LIQUID DETERGENT

Quart Plastic 690

M ellorine
LANE'S 
‘/a Gallon

3 For
o o

PANCAKE MIX 2 Lb. Box AQ*
AUNT JEMIMA With Sample Bottle Aunt Jemima Syrup

MORRISON’S KITS 6 Pkgs. 4 Q C
MIX EM—Cornbread, Biscuits, Spuds 9 ^

RAISINS 15 Oz.
DEL MONTE — Seedless

........... 290

Oleo ROYAL SCOT 
SOLIDS

7 Lbs.
$ 1 0 0


