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Surprise, Surprise, 
It's Another 
Drought 

By DON TABOR 
Publisher 

That guy who blamed me last sum-
mer for drowning his ducks better get 
prepared. 

If it doesn't rain pretty big and pret-
ty soon, I'll be dusting off my pray-
for-rain column and writing it again. 

You may remember that after I 
wrote that column, it rained 12 inches 
in the first 12 days of June and promp-
ted a letter to me from a local man who 
chastized me for messing with Mother 
Nature. He said some of his ducks 
drowned during that rainy spell and 
that I owed him for them. I hope he's 
not still looking for my check. 

Anyway, it's getting dry again, very 
dry. 

And this new drought, coupled with 
the below zero weather we had in 
December, has really hurt the winter 
wheat and oats crop. Many of our cat-
tlemen use this crop to help them out 
on winter feeding and they are not in a 
real good mood right now. 

I went out to Clyde Lake recently 
and I wouldn't recommend that trip for 
curing the winter blues. The lake is 
almost as low as it was before we had 
that June wet spell. 

According to the records we keep at 
the Journal, we've had only about an 
inch and a quarter of rain in over three 
months. Now, if that's not the start of 
a good, solid drought, I don't know 
what is. 

And, my usually-reliable Old 
Farmer's Almanac fumbled the ball on 
this one. While it was saying that 
warm spells would predominate over 
cold ones in December and that there 
would be some heavy rains during the 
month, I was freezing to death under a 
clear sky. 

But I fear that the old farmer is back 
on track when he predicts that rainfall 
will be below normal through March. 

If that does occur, the guy with the 
ducks can rest assured that I will hoist 
the rain-prayer flag. 

So, if he has replaced those drowned 
ones, I would suggest he start giving 
the new ducks swimming lessons. 

USDA Commodities 
Distributed 
Locally 

Central Texas Opportunities, Inc. 
will distribute USDA commodities in 
Callahan County: 

Baird — VFW — Wednesday, 
January 17, 9:30 a.m. to 11 a.m. 

Clyde — Senior Citizens Center —
Wednesday, January 17, 1:30 p.m. to 
2:30 p.m. 

Putnam — City Hall — Wednes-
day, January 17, 3 p.m. to 3:30 p.m. 

Cross Plains — Cross Plains Multi-
Purpose Center, January 18, 8:30 
a.m. to 10:30 a.m. 

Items available this month are: but-
ter, peanut butter, flour, and honey. 

CTO has no control over what items 
are available or the quantity of the 
items. Allocation of all commodities 
depends on the availability of food 
items from the USDA. 

All eligible persons will receive 
emergency food assistance without 
regard to race, sex, political beliefs, 
age, national origin, or handicap. 
Shut-ins are enco raged to designate 
an authorized representative to pick up 
for them. Commodities will be 
distributed on a first come, first serve 
basis. Volunteers are greatly needed 
and appreciated to help with this 
much-needed program. 

Colonial Oaks 
Services 

Pioneer Pentecostal Church will 
conduct services at Colonial Oaks 
Nursing Home Sunday, January 14, at 
3:30 p.m. 

Project Pride has accomplished a lot 
during the first year. Their Annual 
Banquet will be held Tuesday, January 
16, at 6:30 p.m. at the *Cross Plains 
Senior Citizens Center. At this time, 
they will kick-off the Annual Member-
ship Drive. Memberships are $3 per 
person or $5 per couple. 

Entertainment for the evening will 
be C.J. Ledet from Coleman. He and 
his wife will provide dinner music and 
also a program afterwards. 

The highlight of the evening will be 
the drawing for the Community Quilt. 
There are 56 individually handcrafted 
denim squares in the quilt. Last chance 
tickets, for a donation to Project Pride, 
will be available at the Banquet. 

All organizations in the Community 
will be recognized. All members of 

Cottonwood Emergency Service 
wishes to thank each and everyone that 
has helped to get the service off the 
ground and rolling. They are making 
progress towards a service in Cotton-
wood as "first responders" to medical 
and trauma emergencies that they hope 
each of you can be proud of and de-
pend on. 

The C.E.S. is trying to contact as 
many of you as they can by going 
house-to-house for medical informa-
tion that you are able to give them. 
This information is filed, confidential-
ly, to be used only in case of medical 
emergency. So far, they have been to 
houses north of Cottonwood. They 
will be coming into the west and south 
areas soon. 

If you would like to see the equip-
ment you have purchased or have any 
questions about C.E.S, come by the 
Cottonwood Store and they will pro-
udly show it off. 

The following is a list of the dona- 

The Tax-Aide program is a unique 
service which relies upon the efforts of 
volunteers across the country to pro-
vide free income tax counseling to 
older persons. 

Any qualified person can volunteer 
and be trained January 15-19 in Cisco. 
Any expense incurred during training 
or during service will be reimbursed. 

Training courses are conducted in 
December and January, after changes 
in the tax laws have been finalized. 
Tax-Aide has worked with the IRS in 
developing a training program adap-
table to the needs of differing groups. 
Experienced counselors may require 
only a refresher course which includes 
recent changes in tax laws. Less ex-
perienced or beginning counselors will 
require a longer course on advanced 
material on the tax concerns of older 
persons. Training will normally be 
five days, but it can be shortened 
depending on instructor availability, 
counselor needs, or space limitations. 
All training materials, including IRS 
publications, are provided by the IRS. 
The sessions are scheduled where 
space is available and convenient, 
such as libraries, senior centers, and 
community buildings. 

Volunteering for Tax-Aide requires 
a willingnesi to be of service to those 
who need it. Volunteers provide 
assistance without charge, and are not 
legally liable for the accuracy of the 

OIL NEWS 
New Tests 
Callahan 

Pan Petroleum Corp., Cross Plains, 
will drill a wildcat, No. 4R Hutchins, 
to 1,990 feet 1 mile northeast of 
Atwell on an 80-acre lease. Spots 908 
FSL and 1,453 FEL, John Van Winkle 
No. 3, A-521.  

the organizations are urged to come 
and be recognized for a job well done. 

The "all you can eat" fish dinner 
will be $5.50 per person. Please pur-
chase your tickets by January 11, in 
order for the caterer to prepare, at the 
following locations: Greenwood In-
surance, The Back Room, Connie's 
Cuts and Curls, Cross Plains Library, 
Ellen's Closet, or Tim's Floral and 
Gifts. 

Everyone, member or non-member, 
is invited and urged to attend. 

Dress will be casual, as this is going 
to be a festive time to congratulate all 
organizations for their contribution in 
making Cross Plains "A CARING 
COMMUNITY." 

For more information call 725-7712 
or 725-6434. 

tions that have been made: Mr. and 
Mrs. Guy Farquharson $100; Mrs. 
Polly Lawson $50; Mr. and Mrs. 
H.W. Patterson $13; Neal Drug, 100 
exam gloves; Mr. A .H. Coppinger $2; 
Amy Albrecht $20; Mrs. Mable 
Halsell $1; Square A Construction 
$20; Cottonwood Store $20; Haskell 
Holland $5; Dale Donaho $10; 

Harrel Burch $25; Mr. and Mrs. 
John Purvis $25; Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Sowell $10; Mr. and Mn. 
Jerry D. Green $30; Mr. and Mrs. 
Turner Simpson $10; Mr. and Mrs. 
Dub Moore $10; Mr. and Mrs. O.B. 
Joy $20; Mr. and Mrs. John Shepard 
$25; Mr. and Mrs. W.D. Clark $25; 
Mr. and Mrs. C.A. Rodenberger $50; 
and W.M.U., First Baptist Church, 
Baird, bandaging materials. 

The Cottonwood Emergency Ser-
vice expresses their warmest and 
heartfelt thanks to each and everyone 
of you. 

information which they provide. 
Tax-Aide is associated by 

cooperative agreement with Tax 
Counseling for the Elderly (TCE), a 
program sponsored by the IRS tax-
payer education services. Under this 
agreement, funding is available to 
repay the expenses of volunteer 
counselors in carrying out their 
program-related activities and in tak-
ing their training as counselors. 
Counselors may itemize their daily ex-
penses, including their transportation 
costs (currently at the rate of 22.5 
cents per mile if they drive), an occa-
sional meal, and miscellaneous costs 
such as parking, tolls, postage and 
telephone, connected with their work 
or their training. Counselors also have 
the other option of a flat rate payment 
to cover their expenses of counseling, 
attending meetings related to the pro-
gram, and receiving instruction during 
(an in prepartion for) the tax assistance 
season. Full details of this policy will 
be provided at time of training. 

If you are interested in becoming a 
volunteer counselor, call Walter 
Knowlden, Cisco, (817) 442-1715 or 
Yuna V. Burkett, (915) 624-5274. 

Sabanno Cemetery 
Donations 

Recent donations to the Sabanno 
Cemetery Association were Oddie 
Dawkins $20; Oma Faye Cox $20; 
Gene Hicks $20; Opal G. Erwin $25; 
Randy and Judy Foster $20 In memory 
of Truett Dawkins; Sadie Erwin $20 
from Jerl Erwin's children; and Mr. 
Laminack $25. 

The total was $150. 
All donations are appreciated and 

can be sent to Citizens State Bank or 
Sally R. Roady, Cross Plains, TX 
76443.  

GIRL SCOUT COOKIE TIME —
Local bank president, W.G. McCoy, 
takes the easy way out and orders 
cookies from all of "his girls." Shown 

Girl Scout cookie sale time is here 
again — already! Fifty local Girl 
Scouts from the amateur first graders 
to the experienced 6th graders will be 
knocking on doors after school Friday, 
January 12, taking orders for the seven 
delicious varieties of the famous 
cookies. 

The order taking phase of the sale 
will continue through January 29. 
Cookies will be delivered starting on 
February 16 at which time the $2 per 

Say Cheese! 
By JAMIE JONES 

On January 17, a photographer from 
Miller Studio in Stephenville will be 
taking Cross Plains Junior High and 
High School Basketball pictures. 

Each team and individual pictures 
will be taken during their athletic 
periods in the gym. They will be wear-
ing their game uniforms. The coaches 
will choose what color. 

The students will have the oppor-
tunity to order various picture 
packages at the time the pictures are 
taken. Price lists will be sent home 
with each player at a later date. 

Fire Department 
Donations 

Recent donations to the Cross Plains 
Fire Department include: M.W. Smith 
$50; Mrs. Ray Jones $50; Ida Nell 
Williams $15; Doris Givens $25; 
Hazel Ogilvy $20; Dwight Black $25; 
West Texas Utilities $50; J.H. Childs 
$25; Mr. and Mrs. Byron McAnally 
$25; Oddie Dawkins $25; R.T. Wat-
son $100; Floyd Ashley $25; Ruth 
Sunday School Class, First Baptist 
$24; C.C. Coggin Jr $100; 

Dr. and Mrs. Charles Rodenberger 
$100; Mr. and Mrs. C.H. Edington 
$25; Mr. and Mrs. C.T. Gann $25; 
Roy Tatom, Truett Dawkins Memorial 
$20; Mr. and Mrs. Hadden Payne 
$40; Verlin Arrowood $100; Margaret 
McNeel $50; S.E. Paige $20; 
Anonymous $50; B.K. Eubanks $25; 
Lerlene Fortune $25; J. Pat DeBusk 
$25; Joe and Cubelle Harris, Sterling 
Odom Memorial $5; Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Eiring, Sterling Odom Memorial 
$25; Mr. and Mrs. R.N. Tatom $20; 
and Cotula Oil and Gas $200. 

The Cross Plains Fire Department 
greatly appreciates all donations.  

offering Wimpy his choice are bank 
employees Dannes Turner and Terry 
Jane Wyatt, both troop cookie 
chairpersons, and Barbara Dillard, 

box will be due. 
Local troops will keep 20 cents per 

box with an opportunity to earn an ad-
ditional 2 cents per box if all the 
records are turned in on time and are 
correct. The remaining $1.78 per box 
is used to pay for the cookies and the 
expense of operating the sale 
(transportation from the factory, sale 
supplies, advertising and training of 
volunteers who do the local sales). 

Girls may earn a variety of incen-
tives from key rings to stuffed animals 
to T-shirts to "cookie currency" 
which can be redeemed for part of 
their summer camp fee. What is left of 
the $1.78 goes towards maintaining 
and improving the council camp 
facilities at Lake Brownwood. 

Coordinating the local sale is Terry 
Nixon, assisted by Deborah Childers. 
Handling troop level sales are: Dannes 
Turner and Barbara Barnett, Troop 
212; Annette Nickerson and Sheri 
Bennett, Troop 213; Terry Jane Wyatt 
and Arlene Stephenson, Troop 214; 
Terry Bushnell and Mary Davis, 
Troop 215. 

Arlene Stephenson, Service Unit 
Chairman, anticipates a record setting 
sale this year. "We have a lot more 
girls registered than we've had in a 
long, long time and the leaders are do-
ing a fantastic job," she reports. 

She goes on to commend the 
volunteers. "They are a dedicated and 
enthusiastic group and this is carrying 

School Buses To Run 
Early Jan. 11-12 

Cross Plains School Buses will run 
at 2:45 p.m. Thursday, January 11 and 
Friday, January 12, because of Final 
Exams. Students are required to attend 
school all day during the three days of 
exams. Below is a schedule of the ex-
ams to be given: 

Thursday, January 11, 1990 
1st Period 
8:20 a.m. 	 Exam 
3rd Period 
10:20 a.m. 	 Exam 
5th Period 
12:50 p.m. 	 Exam 
2:45 p.m. 	 Buses will run 

Friday, January 12, 1990 
2nd Period 
8:20 a.m. 	 Exam 
4th Period 
10:20 a.m. 	 Exam 
6th Period 
12:50 p.m. 	 Exam 
2:45 p.m. 	 Buses will run  

troop committee member. Helping are 
Jennifer Turner, Amanda Dillard, 
Leaiean and Toni Mae Wyatt. 

over to the girls who are excited about 
the sale and have already made plans 
for using their money." 

Remember, when the Scouts ap-
proach you to order cookies — you are 
supporting a good cause and getting a 
good product. 

Rehab '90 Benefit 
Saturday Night 

"Rehab '90" is a five-hour benefit 
television special originating live from 
the Abilene Civic Center from 7 p.m. 
— midnight, Saturday, January 13. 

About 40 minutes of each hour is 
designated for entertainment. Many of 
your favorite entertainers will be back 
for this special yearly benefit and this 
is predicted to be the best show ever. 

As in previous years, the show in-
cludes an auction which boasts 
$150,000 in donated merchandise, in-
cluding 100 handmade quilts and 
afghans. 

During 1989, 12,000 handicapped 
children and adults were served by the 
Center and came from 110 counties in 
Texas, as well as surrounding states. 

Tickets for Rehab '90 will be $10 
each and are available at WTRC and 
the Abilene Civic Center this week. 

Telephone Service 
Saves Time 

Doing business with Social Security 
does not need to mean a long wait in 
our office, Glyn Hammon, Social 
Security manager in Abilene, said to-
day. 

Most Social Security questions and 
benefit applications can be taken care 
of now by telephone. Office and 
telephone appointment services are 
available too, Hammons said. 

Original documents needed for an 
application, a child's birth certificate, 
for example, can be mailed to the of-
fice. The document will be 
photocopied for their records and 
mailed right back to you. People who 
prefer to bring their documents to the 
office can save time by calling first. 

Toll-free telephone service is now 
available throughout the country. The 
telephone number to call in this area is 
I -800-234-5772 . 

The Abilene Social Security office is 
located at 142 South Pioneer. The of-
fice is open weekdays 9 a.m. — 4:30 
p . m . 

Cottonwood Emergency Service 
Reports Progress And Donations 

AARP Volunteer 
Counselors Are Needed 

Girl Scout Cookie 
Sale Launched 
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Cross Plains Review 2 Thursday, January 11, 1990 
COUNTY COURT 

Mack Kniffen, presiding O.H. Sherrill Jr. of Cross Plains; a 
daughter, Maurine Dickens of 
Houston; two sisters, Ethel Sims of 
Cross wins and Velma Mae Win-
chester of Andrews; three grand-
childrer ; two great-grandchildren; and 
four nieces. 

OBITUARIES  Misdemeanor Filings 
THE PIONEER 
PATCHWORK 

Lozano Meza, Eric Wayne Tull, 
Leonard Lesly Knight. 

COUNTY COURT 
Mack Millen, presiding Myron Dee Nelson, DWI. 

Coy Wayne Neatherlin, resisting ar- 
rest. 

Darlene F. Jones, theft of property 
by check. 

Misdemeanor Minutes 

Charles Arthur Connaley, probation 
revoked and sentenced to 30 days in 
jail. 

Laura Lynn Kittleson, DWI, $750 
fine $146.50 court costs, 60 days jail 
probated for 2 years. 

Leopoldo Palacios Rico, DWI, $350 
fine $146.50 court costs, 30 days jail 

.probated for 18 months. 
Jimmy Wayne Morgan, DWI, $350 

fine $146.50 court costs. 60 days jail 
probated for 9 months. 

Traffic cases dismissed: 
Matthew Pryor, John Curtis Price, 

Gary Wayne Coder, David T. Hill, 
Sabrina Mendez. 

Misdemeanor Minutes Misdemeanor Filings Lawrence 0. Thompson 

CISCO — Lawrence 0. Thompson, 
71, died Wednesday, January 3, at a 
local hospital. 

Services were held at 2 p.m. Satur-
day at Kimbrough Funeral Home 
Chapel with the Rev. Knox Waggoner 
officiating, assisted by the Rev. Larry 
Linam. Burial was in Pisgah Cemetery 
near Cisco. 

Born in Putnam, he was a longtime 
Cisco resident. 

He was a shipping clerk for Burgess 
Industries and a member of the 
American Association of Retired Per-
sons and the Senior Men's Sunday 
School Class at East Cisco Baptist 
Church. 

He was a U.S. Army veteran of 
World War II and a member of 
American Legion Post No. 123, 
Disabled American Veterans and the 
Veterans of Foreign Wars Post in 
Abilene. 

Survivors include his wife, Maurine 
Eudy Thompson of Cisco; a son, 
Larry Thompson of San Angelo; a 
sister, Dene Adams of Midland; two 
brothers, Doyle Thompson of 
Breckenridge and B.J. "Tiny" 
Thompson of Midland; nine grand-
children; and seven great-
grandchildren. 

Carroll S. Tabor 
ALBANY — Carroll S. Tabor, 87, 

died Wednesday, January 3, at a local 
hospital. 

Services were held at 3 p.m. Friday 
at First Baptist Church with the Rev. 
Lloyd Conner officiating. Burial was 
in Albany Cemetery, directed by God-
frey Funeral Home. 

Born in Burkett, he moved to 
Albany 63 years ago. 

He was a retired dairyman and 
worked for the city of Albany. 

Survivors include his wife, Bessie 
Tabor of Albany; two sons, Roy 
Tabor of Kansas and Boyd Tabor of 
Moran; two daughters, Barbara 
Rowntree of Albany and Winnie 
Melton of Burkett; four grand-
daughters; two step-grandchildren; 
and seven great-grandchildren. 

Clara (Mrs. G. C.) Shanks 
BIG SPRING — Services for Clara 

(Mrs. G.C.) Shanks, 92, were held at 
2 p.m. Thursday, January 4, at 
Nalley-Pickle & Welch Rosewood 
Chapel with Royce Clay officiating, 
assisted by the Rev. Dan Burrow. 
Burial was in Trinity Memorial Park. 

She died Tuesday, January 2, at a 
local nursing home. 

Born in Izard County, Ark., she 
moved from Comanche County to Big 
Spring in 194.0. 

She and her late husband, Grover C. 
Shanks, farmed in the Fairview Com-
munity. She was a member of Prairie 
View Baptist Church for more than 25 
years and later of the Baptist Temple 
Church for 20 years. 

Survivors include eight sons, John 
Shanks of Oklahoma City, and Doyle 
Shanks, Grover C. Shanks Jr., and 
Autov Shanks, all of Odessa, and Clim 
Shanks, Charlie Shanks, Howard 
Shanks, and Wade Shanks, all of Big 
Spring; two daughters, Eva May 
Shanks and Jimmye Burks, both of Big 
Spring; three sisters, Ima Jean Payne 
of Pasadena, and Willie Lemon and 
Pearl Caple, both of Benton, Ark.; 25 
grandchildren; 	40 	great- 
grandchildren; and 14 great-great-
grandchildren. 

James C. Heartsill, $186.50 bond 
forfeited but criminal charges drop- 
Ped• 

Joyce Black, theft of property by 
check, $20 fine, $126.50 court costs. 

Traffic cases dismissed: 
Charles Mitchel Wilburn, Bobby 

Lynn Johnson. 

Charles Macfield Steel 
RISING STAR — Charles Mac-

field Steel, 50, died Sunday at a Tem-
ple hospital. 

Services were held at 2 p.m. Tues-
day at First Baptist Church with the 
Rev. Dick Williams officiating, 
assisted by the Rev. Darrell Dossey. 
Burial was in Eastlawn Memorial Park 
in Brownwood, directed by Higgin-
botham Funeral Home. 

He was born in Rising Star. 
A 1957 graduate of Rising Star High 

School, he graduated from Texas Tech 
Jniversity in Lubbock in 1964. He 

was a retired U.S. Army captain, a 
veteran of the Vietnam War and was 
an instructor at Fort Knox, Ky. 

He was an Episcopalian. 
Survivors include two sons, David 

Steel of Albuquerque, N.M. and Brett 
Steel of Blountville, Tenn.; two 
daughters, Holly Hardin of Bloom-
ington, Ill., and Laura Steel of Blount-
ville, Tenn.; his parents, George and 
Emma Jean Steel of Rising Star; a 
brother, James Steel of Waxahachie; a 
sister, Karen Power of Comanche; and 
a granddaughter. 

Eric Wayne Tull, possession of 
marijuana. 

Following charged with DWI: 
Jimmy Wayne Morgan, Pablo 

INIMIMEIMINI11111•111111111111M111 

By IRMA MILLER 

The quilting attendance was down 
on Tuesday at the start of the new 
quilting year. However, the club 
welcomed three visitors: Paul and 
Juanita Harlowe of Loving-ton, New 
Mexico, and Vi Harlowe of Marble 
Falls. Vi is Jean Fore's sister and Paul 
and Juanita are her brother and sister-
in-law 

Vi, Paul, and Juanita spent 
Christmas with Jean, arriving Friday 
and staying over until New Year's. 
Grasson and Myrtle Harlowe of Arl-
ington spent New Year's. D.C. and 
Mary Foster of League City came in 
Friday before New Year's. On Satur-
day, Paul, Juanita, Vi, and Jean went 
to Bangs to visit Juanita's mother, Vi-
vian Foster in the nursing home there. 

John and Irma Miller entertained 
their children on the holidays, who 
came from Houston and Dallas. Pre-
sent were David Miller and his two 
children, David Keith and Elizabeth, 
and Sam Miller, all from suburbs of 
Houston, and Mary and Bill Lagow of 
Dallas. 

Cecil and Mary Barton of Waco 
were here on the holidays to visit their 
parents, Cleo and Novilia Barton. 
Other visitors they enjoyed were Wan-
da and Tom Flippin and their 
daughter, Billie Lee Freeman, Rev. 
Dwayne Clowers, all of our communi-
ty; and John Watson of Beaumont and 
Harry Watson of Dallas, who are 
brothers. 

The Huttons had their family gather-
ing on December 23, and almost 
everyone was present and enjoyed a 
wonderful dinner. Cowan and Laverne 
went and visited their children at An-
ton, and Cowan's mother at Lubbock, 
right after Christmas. Laverne's 
mother, Ella Dean, is slowly improv-
ing after the flu, and Laverne was 
preparing to take her lunch to her at 
the time she gave this information on 
January 5. 

James and Jean Alexander's guests 
for the holiday weekend were Star Ap-
pleton and her two daughters, Heather 
and Andrea of Corpus Christi; Jim and 
Marla Alexander of Richardson and 
their three boys, Doss, Jack and Will; 
and May and D.T. Jones of Corpus 
Christi. 

Political 
„_Calendar, 

MARRIAGE LICENSE 

Lori Denise Byrd and Patrick Keith 
Swaner of Abilene. The Cross Plains Review is author-

ized to publish the following political 
announcements for the Callahan 
County office filings in the upcoming 
March 13, 1990 primary election for 
the Democratic Party. 

NEW VEHYCLES 

Stan McCormick, Baird, Chev. PU. 
J.W. and Hope Evans, Baird, Chev. 

PU. 
Decker Construction, Abilene, 

Chev. PU. 
Randy and Jammie Jones, Abilene, 

Chev. Sub. 
Steve Corp, Abilene, Chev. Sub. 
Jimmy Herman, Abilene, GMC 

Sub. 
Cary Reed, Abilene, GMC PU. 
Raynaldo Carrion, Jr., Abilene, 

Pont. 4 dr. 
Bob and Dorothy Lynch, Clyde, 

GMC Van. 
Glen Blackman, Clyde, Pont. 2 dr. 
Becky Whiteaker, Arlington, Pont. 

2 dr. 
Paul and Sybil Reynolds, Snyder, 

Chev. PU. 
Barr Roofing, Abilene, GMC PU. 
James Breeden, Albany, Chev. 4 dr. 
Brenda Coleman, Stamford, Pont. 4 

dr. 
Pam Hindman, Abilene, Chev. 

Van. 
Eugene Kniffen, Clyde, Chev. PU. 
Robert Oglesby, Abilene, Chev. 4 

dr. 
Susan Hare, Breckenridge, Chev. 

PU. 
E.R. Thomas, Ranger, Pont. 2 dr. 
Bill Hart, Baird, Chev. PU. 

For 17th District 
U.S. Congress 
Charles Stenholm 

MARRIAGE LICENSE 

Carolyn Sue Whitecotton and Jim-
my Dale Kirkland of Baird. 

Pd. Ads. pt omo! end Paid fir by tea Stator to COWS= 
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For 42nd District 
Court Clerk 
Cubelle Harris 

West Texas Utilities, Abilene, 
Chev. 4 dr. 

Johnny L. Bull, Abilene, Chev. 
Van. 

Floyd and Eva Bennett, Austin, 
GMC Jimmy. 

Maxey Chittum, Abilene, Chev. 
PU. 

Glenn Rucker, Abilene, Chev. PU. 
Gary Glover, Palo Pinto, Pont. 4 dr. 
Homer Simons, Cross Plains, Ford 

PU. 

merican Cancer 
Society Urges 
Cancer Checkups 

Pd. Ado. Pt bo Caddo Norris. 304 w. 9th, Baird, Tar 79504 

Judli Gulle 
Pd. Ado. . by Judo Gahm Yard. Tar 79504 

For Callahan 
County Judge 
Bill Johnson 

If a cancer can be detected before it 
spreads beyond its site of origin, it is 
much easier to treat successfully. For 
example, early breast cancer treated in 
a localized stage has a five-year sur-
vival rate of 87%, compared to 47% 
once the cancer has spread beyond the 
breast. 

Cancer is usually found either by a 
physician during a cancer-related 
checkup or by an individual who 
notices a warning signal and seeks 
medical attention. 

A physician can best advise you on 
the frequency of necessary checkups, 
based on the guidelines recommended 
by the American Cancer Society. 

The aims of the American Cancer 
Society are to motivate all Americans 
to have regular cancer-related 
checkups; to be aware of, and act on, 
cancer's warning signals; and to adopt 
healthy habits which can prevent 
cancer. 

42nd DISTRICT COURT 
Don Lane, presiding Bird, Pd. Me. Pd. by Bil John= fttripior, Tom Ity. mum, 

Taus 79504 

Bill Coots Civil Filings 
coney,  Clyde. Pd. Adv. Poi by 91 C0013 

Tams 79510 
JOhn Gas. truant 

State vs. Myron Claude Fellows, 
suit for reimbursement. 

First National Bank, Baird, vs. 
Dickey and Diana Graves, unpaid ac-
count. 

First National Bank, Baird, vs. Lin-
da Luckie, d/b/a Keestone T. Shirt, 
unpaid account. 

Kempco Petroleum vs. Dick Grider 
d/b/a Grider Gulf, unpaid account. 

Divorces filed: 
Canada, David Lynn, Jr. and 

Kimberly Elaine. 
Hernandez, Manuel A. and Yolan-

da. 
Hitchcock, Leta and Jerry D., and 

in the interest of minor children. 
Bonnett, Whitney and James Neal, 

and in the interest of minor child. 
Smith, Jill and Kevin. 
Fernandez, Kimberly Jean and 

Larry Dean, and in the interest of 
minor child. 

Blackburn, Susan and John Frasher, 
and in the interest of minor child. 

Jim Rumage 
Pd. Ads. Pt by Jim Rump. Clyde. Taus 79510 

Jon Herod 42nd DISTRICT COURT 
Don Lane, presiding Pot Ada. Pt by Jon Arai Clyde, TIM 79510 

Callahan County 
Treasurer 
LaVada Poindexter 

Civil Filings 

Rolland Lee Rivers vs. City of 
ilaird, workman's comp. 

Leaf, Inc. vs. Grumpe's Specialties, 
unpaid account. 

Hargrove, Fredene and Darrell Lee, 
divorce. 

Pal Ada. Pd b7 Lovas Polnautr, Clyde, Texas 795 

Dora Hounshell 
Pol. Ado. Pt by Nos Harrill, Star Rt I, Bird, Taus 79504 

All political calendar advertising is 
payable in advance, at a cost of 
$65.00. A free press release and 
photograph will be published with 
each announcement. 
mi • sa as In NI INN ▪  III 

Civil Minutes CHURCH DIRECTORY 
Delorice Krinke vs. Adolph Muzny, 

temporary injunction granted. 

UNITED PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
9TH & AVE. D 	 CROSS PLAINS 

WORSHIP SERVICE 	 9:30 A.M. 
BIBLE CLASS 	 10:30 A.M. 

Jasper McClellan, Pastor 
Everyone Welcome 

PUBLICATION COPY - COMMERCIAL AND SAVINGS BANKS 
CONSOLIDATED REPORT OF CONDITION (IreJudInp Demesne end Foreign Subsidiaries) Civil Minutes < 579> 	stare on (7- 

STATE BANK NO 

1637-20  
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11 19 38191 
CLOSE OF BUSINESS DATE 

Dscem >sr 3,1 I 89 

DON,  Arnonoll In Thousands 
7   

LEGAL. TITLE OF BANK 

Citizens State Bank 
Box 699 
Cross Plains, Texas 

CITY 

Cross Plains 

Fulcher, Monica Anita and Bruce 
Allan, divorce granted. 

Crescent Supply vs. Formation Ser-
vices, dismissed. 

C.P.D. Factoring vs. Shirley Sasin, 
d/b/a Decorators Dream and My 
Bungalow. 

State vs. Greg Lance Discus, 
dismissed. 

Bessie Lambert vs. Dollie Smith, 
original judgment upheld by 11th 
Court of Appeals. 

State vs. Genevieve Lamoree and 
Roy Lamoree, obligors found to owe 
the state $1,901.00 which must be 
repaid monthly. 

76443 
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Taxes  
ZIP CODE COUNTY 

Callahan  BELIEVER'S FELLOWSHIP 
Full Gospel Church 

Sunday School 	
East Highway 36 

Morning Worship  	.10:43  pain 
Evening Worship 	 V. •• *MI wow/mm.6 ••••••• Ili pai 
Wednesday plight Bible Study & 

Charlie Fortenberry, Pastor 725-6607  
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10TH & MAIN 	CROSS PLAINS 

	

Sunday School 	  
-0- (817) 725-7629 

9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 11:00 a.m. 
Church Training 	 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	 7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Prayer Service 	 7:15 p.m. 

Michael Hale, Pastor- 725-7556 	 Marvin Saunders, WY Dlr.-725-7550 
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Ellen M. Sherrill, 75, died Friday at 
a San Angelo hospital. 

Services were held at 10 a.m. Mon-
day at Higginbotham Funeral Home 
Chapel with the Rev. Jasper Mc-
Clellan and John Swift, officiating. 
Burial was in Cedar Hill Cemetery in 
Abilene. 

Born in Millersview, she moved to 
Cross Plains in 1976 from Odessa. She 
was a catalog sales clerk for Sears for 
20 years and was a Presbyterian. 

Survivors include her husband, 
O.H. Sherrill of Cross Plains; a son, 

Jerry Gene Weatherford, oilfield 
theft charges dismissed due to defen-
dant being deceased. 
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Mrs. Suma Dill's visitors last week 
were Mr. and Mrs. Skeet Walker, Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo Thompson, Collis 
Eager, Eunice Starr, Jeanette Wigin-
ton, all locally, and Gaylon Duggan of 
Rising Star, 
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COTTONWOOD BAPTIST CHURCH 

SERVICES: Sunday SchooIWHERE JESUS IS LORD' 	9:45 A.M. 
Morning Worship, 	.. ...... ..............   	......11:00 A.M. 
Training Union & Youth Chnk....... 	• 	 6:00 P.M. 
Evening WorshIp.................______ 	 7:00 P.M. 
Wed. Evening Prayer Sorvle.a..--.....- 	 7:30 P.M. 
Sunday Choir Practice.................... — 	6:00 P M .. 	. 
Knox Waggoner, Pastor 	 _ 	_  

Located at 	CHURCH OF CHRIST 	Phone 
7254117 12th & Main 	 Cross Plains 

COME WORSHIP WITH US WHERE CHRIST IS HONORED 
Sunday Morning BIM* Class-..-»..9:45 &M. 	Wed. Morning 
Sunday Morning Worship......_ _10:45 A.M. 	Ladlis Bible Class 
Sunday Evening Worship.............6:00 P.M. 	(Seasonal) 10:00 A.M. 
Wed. Evening Bible Study 	7:00 P.M. 

	

Como now, and let us reason together" 	Isiah 148 	, 

WE WELCOME ONE AND ALL 
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BILL COOTS 
...Callahan County Judge Candidate 

Bill Coots Announces 
County Judge Candidacy 

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY 

 

An Equal 
Opportunity 
Employer 

 

A Member of The Central and South West System 
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• 
A power outage can 

occasionally occur due to 
ice and snow on power lines, 
falling tree limbs and high winds. When 
It does, WTU will take the proper steps to assure 
your power is restored as wieldy as possible. 

Here's what you can do to help: 
D Check with your neighbors to see how widespread 

the outage Is. 
0 Check your breaker box If your house is the only 

one affected. 
0 Call your local WTU office if the trouble Is not on 

your side of the meter. 

Serving you with dependable electric energy from 
the Red River to the Rio Grande. 

Callahan County rancher and retired 
Army officer, Bill Coots has announced 
his candidacy for Callahan County 
Judge. In making his announcement., 
Bill stated, "Callahan County faces 
many challenges regarding judicial 
decisions, the economic and financial 
operations of the County, and the 
continuing growth of our County. I 
have the experience, education, and 
qualifications to effectively serve the 
people of this County in meeting and 
solving these problems." 

Bill, age 48, enlisted in the Army in 
1961, graduated from Army Officer 
Candidate School in 1965, Army Flight 
School in 1968, and Army Test Pilot 
School in 1978. He also attended 
numerous civilian and military schools 
in the continuance of his advanced 
education. 	Bill acquired business 
experience while in the military when 
he established and managed for three 
years a successful retail sporting goods 
business, which he sold only when 
receiving orders to move to a new duty 
station. He retired from the Army in 
1981. 

During his time in service, Bill served 
in numerous positions of responsibility 
and command some of which include 
that of a Commanding Officer, a Supply 
Officer, and a Security Officer. He 
served on Court Martials Boards and 
served as defense counsel and trial 
(prosecuting) counsel. He has been 
awarded numerous honors, some of 
which are the Distinguished Flying 
Cross for Heroism, the Air Medal for 
Valor, 2 Bronze Star Medals, the Purple 
Heart Medal, and the Meritorious 
Service Medal. 

Serving as a Commanding Officer and 
as both a defense and trial counsel has 
given him exceptional insight into the 
problems of our criminal justice 
system. The crime of child abuse, 
marital problems, financial problems, 
and the devastating effect of alcohol and 
drugs on our society are problems that 
he has dealt with first hand. Having seen 
the cruel effects of crime, alcohol and 
drugs, he will fight to break the grip of 
these problems on the citizens of 
Callahan County. 
In preparation for Bill's retirement 

from the Army, he and Jane purchased 
property in Callahan County as early as 
1977, choosing Callahan County 
because of close family ties and roots in 
this area. Then, urn his retirement in 
1981, they established their home here. 

Bill worked with rancher Warren 
Price of Rowden,Texas, for several 
years prior to his retirement from the 
Army. Upon retiring, he entered 
partnership with Price. After Price's 
death in 1986, B'll continued in the 
ranching business. 	established and 
manages Coots Cattle Company, a 
registered Beefmaster and commercial 
cow-calf operation. 

Bill was born and reared in Big 
Spring, Texas, where he met and 
married Jane Smedley, the daughter of 
the late Vergil Smedley and of Thelma 
Griffin Smedley, both of Callahan 
County. They have two sons, William 
V. (Billy) Coots of Abilene and 
Christopher Brian Coots, who recently 
graduated from Texas A & M 
University. 

Bill is active in community affairs  

where he serves with the Goodfellows, 
is a member of the Callahan County 
Historical Commission, and is President 
of the Kiwanis Club of Clyde. Bill and 
his wife, Jane, are members of Clyde 
First Baptist Church where he is an 
active deacon and serves as church 
Sunday School Director. 

Having been introduced to you, the 
voters of Callahan County, and 
believing that all of my experience to 
date uniquely prepares me to serve you 
effectively, I ask for your vote on 
March 13. If elected as your County 
Judge, I will dedicate myself to doing 
the very best job possible to serve the 
people of Callahan County. 

Poi. Ad Paid By Bill Coats, Baird, Taw. 

Beef Cattle Nutrition 
And Management 
Meeting On Jan. 15 

Dry weather is still the major topic 
among beef cattle producers in the cof-
fee shop and feed store and feeding of 
livestock is at an all time high, accor-
ding to Greg Gerngross, County Ex-
tension Agent. 

A Beef Cattle Nutrition and 
Management meeting will be held 
Monday, January 15, at 7:30 p.m. in 
the County Courtroom, according to 
Greg Gerngross, County Extension 
Agent. With continued dry weather, 
feeding of livestock is of prime impor-
tance and will continue to be for the 
next few months. 

To help producers make the most of 
their feed dollars, the Livestock and 
Range Committee is sponsoring this 
educational meeting in cooperation 
with the Callahan County Extension 
office. 

Dr. Jerry Cowley, Extension 
Livestock Specialist from San Angelo, 
will be program speaker for the 
meeting. Dr. Cowley will be discuss-
ing nutritional needs of various classes 
of livestock plus other management 
considerations to get through the dry 
weather. Cowley will also be discuss-
ing reproduction diseases and how 
they can affect a producer's calf crop. 

Everyone is invited to attend the 
meeting on the 15th. 

Educational programs conducted by 
the Texas Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice serve people of all ages regardless 
of socio-economic levels, race, color, 
sex, religion, handicap or national 
origin. 

For more information on the 
meeting, contact the County Extension 
office at (915) 854-1518. 

By MRS. N.V. GIBBS 

Already the second week of 1990 is 
upon us. The weather has not been 
bad, but rain is needed more than ever. 

One farmer was plowing Saturday 
afternoon, maybe it was to keep the 
ground stirred so wind storms would 
nor blow the top soil into the fence 
rows. One other field of grain that 
wasn't grazed until late fall is looking 
green, so there may be a chance for a 
crop. Other fields look very dead. 

Company of Gene and Vernie Belle 
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HAPPY • • • 

BIRTHDAY 
Ilit•••••••••••••••••101  

JANUARY 12 
Fred Flippin 
Patricia Driskill 
J.W. Woody 
Mike Walters 
Rev. Dan Applin 
Keri Machelle Bowman 

JANUARY 13 
Mrs. V.I. Spivey 
Barbara Clark 
Sylvia Graham 
Cindy Sue Payne 
Kenneth E. Dobbins 
Edith Adkins 
Mrs. Albert Lee 
Loran Lee 
Randy Dillard 
Cecilia Smoot 
Earl Montgomery 
John Terrell Gardner 

JANUARY 14 
Lorissa Gressett 
Mrs. Exal D. McMillan 
Charles Pippins 
Johnny Illingworth 
Le'Ann Jordan 
John Roberts 
Linda Chandler 
Mrs. Kate Powell 
Crystal Nelson 
Ileen Smith 
Jessica Childers 
Todd Watson 
Sam Fleming, Jr. 

JANUARY 15 
David Strickland 
Gary Childers 
Mrs. C.R. Cook 
Starr Appleton 
Mrs. Jackie Pancake 
Regina Fleming 
Mrs. Vernon Donaway 
Velma Byers 
Monty Richards 
A.C. Gaines 
Marian Reed 

JANUARY 16 
Laurie Lavender 
Mrs. Raymond Young 
Trivina Newman 
Rickey Jones 
Barbara Havener 
Art Fisher 
Betty Randell 
Mrs. C.L. Mllam 

JANUARY 17 
H.R. Jefferies 
Brandi Richey 
Thressa Driskill 
Staci Strickland 
Ladora Allen 
Mrs. George Watkins 
Anthony Randall Wilson 
Anna Marie Smith 
Ura Mae Jones 
Dana Teeters 
Christian Noah Wells 

JANUARY 18 
David Wells 
Ricky Sanders 
Jacky Hinkle 
Martha Malone 
Donna Barnes 
Ann Harper 
Frank Aiken 
Mrs. Buck Edgar 
Mrs. Van Campbell 
Shana Sharee Segura 
Mary Diana Rankin 
Frances Irwin 
Conda Odom 
Dennis Payne 
Jewel Archer 
Tina (McCowen) Alkins 
Roger Rudloff  

Mauldin during the week were James 
Reynolds and Roland and Faye 
Mauldin, who came over Monday, 
January 1, to eat blackeyed peas. 
Saturday their granddaughter, Melin-
da Maninger and daughter, Laura of 
Weatherford, were there for a visit. 

Don and Maryanna Harrell and 
Leigh had visitors from Austin that ar-
rived Thursday, Griff and Melissa An-
drews and son, Billy. Melissa is a 
sister of Maryanna. 

Tresha Albrecht of Cottonwood 
spent Friday night with Tonya Steele. 

This writer was in Abilene Wednes-
day and visited Elveda Sikes. 

Little Drew Flippin of Midlothian 
spent last weekend with his grand-
parents, James and Dorothy Reynolds. 

Robert and Dorothy Watson drove 
to Lake Leon Sunday where they 
visited his sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Beck and children. His 
mother and dad, Mr. and Mrs. R.G. 
Watson, also were visiting in the 
home. They stopped in Ranger for a 
visit with Dorothy's brother and fami-
ly, Mr. and Mrs. Sterling Thames. 
The Watson family were in Panther 
Creek Saturday for a basketball tour-
nament. 

Visitors of Joyce Odom during the 
week were relatives from Baird, Nila 
Towler and Faye White and this 
writer. 

Defensive Driving 
Courses At CJC 

Cisco Junior College will offer a 
Defensive Driving Course on Monday 
and Tuesday, January 15 and 16, from 
6-10 p.m. The class will meet in Room 
3 of Schaefer Hall. Fee for the course 
is $20. Enrollment fees must be paid 
no later than 3 p.m. on January 15. 
Students must attend both nights of 
class. No late registration fees will be 
accepted. 

For more information contact 
Charlotte Speegle at 442-2567, exten-
sion 122. 
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January 2 — 5 

"Reach for a star. Come to the 
library." 

Howard-related out-of-town guests 
in December: 5 
Book Sales: 

"One Who Walked Alone," 
Novalyne Price Ellis, 3 copies. 

"Day of the Stranger: Further 
Memories of Robert Howard," Ellis, 
5 copies. 
Donations: 

City of Cross Plains, Debbie Mer- 
ryman, Connie Kirkham. 

Books and Magazines: Mr. and 
Mrs. O.B. Joy. 

Memorial: For Dorothy Pittman 
Blair by the Class of '69. 
Circulation: 215 

Paperback: 54 
Hardback: 140 
Extension: 21 
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LAKEWOOD 
NEWS 

amiesea•m•m•am•••••• 
By BETTY WESTERMAN 

Lakewood Recreation Center is hav-
ing a membership drive through 
February 15. You can join the club 
simply by paying your first month's 
membership fee of $20. Family 
membership includes husband, wife, 
and all children under age 18 who live 
at home. 

We've had lots of fun this year, and 
we are planning even more events for 
1990. So sign up now and come join 
us. 

Be sure and come to the monthly 
supper this month. It will be on Tues-
day, January 30, at 7 p.m. We will be 
nominating and voting on the new 
board members, so we need everyone 
present who can be there. 

Cross Plains Review 	2 
Thursday, January 11, 1990 J 
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By ESTHLOY S. DICKSON 

The sun is shining beautifully this 
Monday morning — but it is much col-
der out there than it looks. Birds were 
'skating' on the birdbath early this 
morning. 

Sally Roady reports that Ms. Nettie 
has had some bad days lately — she is 
.better this morning — they keep a 
close watch on her every day. Joe 
McNeil, a nephew of Clyde, visited 
them on Saturday. Their grandson, 
Charlie, spent Friday and Saturday 
with them. Their sons, Joe of 
Brownwood and George of Dallas, 
called them during the weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. William Beggs of 
Austin visited J.T. and Betty last 
weekend. L.W. Mitchell visited them 
on Saturday. David Beggs of Morton 
Valley visited one day. 

The Ronnie Hutchins family was in 
the community last weekend. Helen 
and Cole Tillotson attended the Sher-
rill funeral on Monday. 

Ms. Jewel Foster attended the 
"Quiltings" last week, and she was in 
Sunday School and church on Sunday. 

Howard and Charlene McGowen 
reported that they have finally 
recuperated from the 'flu' — their kids 
are back in school, and all was going 
well with them this Monday morning. 

I'm hoping I'll find someone to 
move the leaves off my front lawn this 
week — they are 'knee-deep' in 
places. I just don't have the strength to 
rake them myself. 

The booming sound of a plane pas-
sing the sound barrier cannot be 
heard by the pilot. 

■ 
■ 

Cross Plains Auto ,Supply § 

HYDRAULIC HOSES 
Made For Equipment Needs! 

1/4" to 1 114" 
Trucks lit Tractors 

838 Main 	 (817) 725-6212 
/7 	 4 



THE 
Insertion Deadline 

Noon Monday 

CLASSIFIED RATES 
$3.00 for the first 20 
words. Additional 
words 200 each. 

CLASSIFIED 
ADS 

r 

41, FOR RESULTS PUT IT 
725-6111 Cross Plains Review 

Thursday, January 11, 1990 

STEEL RADIAL 
PERFORMANCE 

Arri rat 	s 

RADIAL XL 
PRICES AS LOW AS 

$3995  
• Protection From 

Road Hazards 
• Eziro Iteadwear 

Please Contact 
Robert Ringhoffer 

at 

I Ian ner 
Chevrolet 

1 241 Itaird 
851 1133 	673 6071 

‘Ipilcur 

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

1. Sealed proposals addressed to 
Mr. Don Harris, President, Board of 
Trustees, in care of Mr. Lee Thomp-
son, Superintendent of Schools, Cross 
Plains Independent School District, 
Cross Plains, Texas, shall be received 
by 7:30 p.m. on Thursday, January 
25, 1990, in the Board Room of the 
Cross Plains Independent School 
District, located in the High School 
Building, P.O. Box 669, 1464 Main 
Street, Cross Plains, Texas 76443, at 
which time they will be publicly open-
ed and read aloud, for the furnishing 
of all labor, materials and equipment, 
and performing all work required for 
A New Elementary Facility for Cross 
Plains Independent School District, 
Cross Plains, Texas, in compliance 
with plans, specifications, and con-
tract documents, as prepared by 
Huckabee & Donham, Architects and 
Planners, Stephenville, Texas 76401. 

2. Lump sum proposal will be 
received for the general construction, 
which will include all mechanical, 
electrical, and plumbing work. 

3. A Cashier's Check, Certified 
Check, or acceptable Bidder's Bond, 

A DIFFERENCE AT 
FOOD PLAZA 

We we interested in hiring persons who possess the 
following qualities: Personal Integrity & Dependability. 
Wfingness To Work & Contribute To A Progressive 
Organization. An Ability To Work In A Fest Paced Work 
Environment. An Outgoing Personaity With An Eagerness 
To Serve The Public. Personal Schedule Flexibility. Per. 
swat Phone Number. High School Diplome or Equivalent. 

If You Feel You Meet All Of These Criteria, Please Apply 
At 
Your Food Plus in Cross Plains or cat 725-6179 

(Drug Summing Required). 

eW4/110111111111161-- _.../11111  
.0" 

AIR OF QUALITY _ 

Sales, Installation, Service on 
Rheem Equipment; Service all 
makes and models; Prompt, Reli-
able, Honest....Free estimates on 
new installation....Financing avail-
able; Licensed and insured.... 

Andrews Refrigerellen 
Air Conditioning 

Charles Andrews 	624-5544 
Owner 	 (Call Collect] 

payable to the Cross Plains Indepen-
dent School District, in the amount of 
not less than 5% of the largest possible 
total for the bid submitted, must ac-
company each bid. 

4. The successful bidder will be re-
quired to enter into a contract with the 
Cross Plains Independent School 
District, Cross Plains, Texas, and to 
furnish a Performance and Payment 
Bond in the amount of not less than 
100% of the contract price, condition-
ed upon the performance of the con-
tract. 

5. Attention is called to the fact that 
the contractor must comply with all 
Federal, State and local labor laws, in-
cluding Article 5159a, Vernon's An-
notated Revised Civil Statutes of the 
State of Texas. 

6. The bidder acknowledges the 
right of the Owner to reject any or all 
bids and to waive any informality or 
irregularity in any bid received. In ad-
dition, the bidder recognizes the right 
of the Owner to reject a bid if the bid-
der failed to furnish any required bid 
security or to submit the data required 
by the bidding documents, or if the bid 
is in any way incomplete or irregular. 

41-2tc 

 

FOR SALE 

 

FOR YOUR MARY KAY PRO-
DUCTS call Pauniece Oglesby, 
725-6772. Have all Mary Kay 
Cosmetics line in stock - ladies and 
men's skin care, body and fragrance 
items. Free Delivery, Gift Wrapping. 

 

32-tfc 

MONUMENTS AND MEMORI-
ALS Cliff Kirkham is agent for Riley-
Gardener Monument Service of 
Hamilton, Texas for the Cross Plains 
area. Contact Cliff Kirkham for com-
plete information on quality 
monuments. Call (817) 725-6500.  1-tic 

PIANO FOR SALE 
Wanted: Responsible party to take on 
small monthly payments on piano. See 
locally. Call Manager at 
800-635-7611 anytime. 	 393tc 

PIANO FOR SALE 
Wanted responsible party to assume 
small monthly payments on piano. See 
locally. Call Credit Manager at 
1400-2334663. 	 39-3tp 

NEW SHIPMENT' LADIES 
SILVERLAKE JEANS, Khaki, dark 
denim & hurricane wash, 4 new 
styles, size 1-15, $29.99. Johnson's 

 

Dry Goods. 	 41-1tc 

 

BUSINESS & 
PROFESSIONAL 

DIRECTORY 
Russell Surles 
Abstract Co. 

Prompt & Dependable 
Abstract Service! 

337 Market Street 
Baird, Texas 

Charles Walker, Owner 

Ross L. Jones 
Attorney 

Open Each Wed. 9 am-Noon 

Johnson, Jones 
& Autry 

9th & Main - 
(Qid Doi-Mar Bldg) 

(817) 725-6747 
Coleman: (915) 625-2146 

Cross Plains 
Business 

Service 
751 Main Street 
(817) 725-7712 
Hours: 8:30-4:30_,  

Susan J. Schaefer, 
C.P.A.  

Accounting & Tax 
Service 
9th & Main 
Cross Plains 

Phone: 725-6747 

 

REGISTERED 
PUBLIC 

SURVEYOR 
JOHN D. BURLESON 
BOX 365 CROSS PLAINS 

817-725-6485 
OIL WELL LOCATIONS, 

LOTS, PIPELINES 

Card Of Thanks 
May I sincerely thank each of you 

for your visits, calls, cards, flowers 
and food at the time of my mom's (Ida 
R. Gray) passing. 

It meant so much for you to 
remember me in so many ways at this 
particular time. 

Merillyn 
Card Of Thanks 

Delbert and I would like to thank 
everyone for their prayers, gifts and 
calls during our stays in the hospital. 
We were really touched by the outpour 
of concern. 

We would like to say a very special 
thank you to Connie Kirkham and 
family, Hungry and Clara Nell 
Spencer, and the Beta Sigma Phi. You 
are all very special people and you'll 
never know how much you helped us. 

I would also like to thank everyone 
for the wonderful gifts we were given 
for our new daughter, Hailey, and to 
apologize for not having sent out per-
sonal thank you cards yet. I hope you 
all understand and forgive me. 

Sincerely, 
Delbert and Charlotte Biggs 

ANNOUNCEMENTS  

ELLEN'S CLOSET DRY CLEAN-
ING - Laundry substation, open 9 to 
5:30, Monday Thru Friday, 7254322. 

33-He 

FUR BUYING - Each Sunday from 
11:30 - 12:30 - Front of Lakeway 
Store, "Jim." 	 41.2tp 

ARLENE'S ALTERATIONS is 
open for business again. Thank you 
for your patience and understanding 
while I was closed. Call 725-6879 for 
all your alteration needs. 	 41-2tp 

I AM NO LONGER RESPONSI-
BLE for any debts incurred by Debra 
D. Brown. Thomas D. Brown. 41-31 

SHREDDING & 
GARDEN PLOWING 

John Aiken 
Telephone (817) 725-7198 

P.O. Box 174 
Cross Plains, TeXas 76443 

52 tic 

	 "'"% 
DRAIN & SEWER 

REPAIR 
PLUMBING REPAIR 

Ott C ENTERPRISE 

 

BENNY CALLAWAY 

725-6200 

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS 
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENT 
LILLISTON-KMC 

PLANTERS-DISKS-DRILLS 
ROLLING CULTIVATORS 

CHISELS 
SELL OR TRADE 

CLARK TRACTOR & SUPPLY, INC  
DELEON (817) 893-2061 - 
COMANCHE (915) 356-3922 

WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED 

Loulds 
Pumps... 
World's most 
popular brand 
for water 
supply. 

t-I41'' 

4iNO 
Drink ng Water 

Systems 
Softeners 	Filters 

BrunerlGoulds... 
Now making water 
the best quality! 
Ask us about the exclusive line 
of pumps and water treatment 
products: 

DALE 
CRAWFORD 

WATER WELL 
SERVICE 
(817) 725-7535 

19-dc 

Mobile Ph. (817) 725-6356 
(After Beep) Dial 90 

Cross Plains, Texas 76443 

DORA SMITH 
Real Estate Broker 

(817) 725-6489 
Cross Plains, Texas 

* 3 bdrm., 2 baths, large corner 
lot, carport, water well, storage, 
$16,500. 
* 1980 Wayside Mobile Home, 2 
bdrm., 2 full baths, CA/H, ex-
cellent condition, Only $6,000. 
* 2 bdrm. remodeled home on 4 
lots, 2 apartment bldgs., shop, RV 
shelter, extras! Great income pro-
ducing property! $30,000. 
* 5 lots, 2 bdrm. home, very nice, 
by Johnston Trucking, $19,500. 
* 3 bdrm., 2 bath, extra nice, on 
162 ac., water, horse stalls, riding 
arena, stock tanks, $128,000. 
* 2 bdrm., corner lot, only 
$6,500. 
* Large lot and 3,600 sq. ft. 
warehouse/oljice bldg. in Rising 
Star, Reduced to $9,500. 
* 2 bdrm. on 2 acres, CH/A, fruit 
trees, water well, Highway 36, 
$25,000. 
* 95 ac., 2 water wells, pasture, 
sudan, $43,500. 
* 7.5 acres, 2 bedroom house, 
well, storage bldgs., grass, pens, at 
Cottonwood, $15,000. 

REAL ESTATE 

MUST SELL 2 bdrm. house, 581 9th 
St., $7,000. 725-7332. 	 37-dc 

HOUSE FOR SALE - 3 bedrooms, 
11/2  baths, on 4 lots $18,000. Call 
725-6514 or 725-6733. 	 311-44c 

ATTENTION - GOVERNMENT 
HOMES from $1 (U-repair). Delin-
quent tax property. Repossessions. 
Call 1-602-8384885 Ext. GH4469. 

40-4m 

FOR SALE 
BY OWNER 

149 plus acres, 100 acres in cultiva-
tion rest in pasture, good fences, 
large stock tank, 2 barns, small pig 
barn, large new shop, lovely 3 
bdrm., 2 bath country home, large 
family kitchen with lots of cabinets, 
double car port, close to town. Call 
(915) 784-5153. 	 38-dc 

EXPERT BODY WORK AND PAINTING 

BARRETT BODY SHOP  • 
, CLAUDE CHAMPION, OWNER 

.11WFOIIRSP.cEIGNmrARIS & 	915-  677-2924  ABILENE, TX.79603 
• LUXURY CARS 24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 

214 N. LEGGETT 	 915-672-4064 
IN so on Num swam mum .....Immisma 

Beautiful 3 bedroom hems, 
large muter bedroom, 2 fell 
baths, formal dining room. 2 liv-
ing areas, over 2,000 sq. ft., sad 
central heat and air. 

Covered patio, workshop. led 
hugh outside storage, and water 
softener. Extra lot. 8 pecan tress 
and mach mors. Priced below 
market value. Shown by appoint-
ment on! . (817) 725.7164 

322 acres on Bayou South of 
Cross Plains. Good bottom land, 
good hunting under $400.00 per 
acre. 

120 acres, good hunting-South 
of Santa Anna. 

Gene Gibson Real Estate 
(915) 646-9350 

FOR SALE 
BY OWNER 

Best waterfront on Lake 
Brownwood, 3 bdrm., 1 1/2  bath, 
large living, dining and kitchen 
area, new paint and carpet, CH/A, 
storm windows, lots of closet and 
storage, boat dock, double car port, 
and cellar. 7 miles from 
Brownwood, TV cable and trash 
pickup available. Will sell com-
pletely furnished. (915) 784-5153. 

	• 

138 A. on Hwy. N. of Cross 
Plains, Well, Tank, Deer, 
Turkey, $325 A. 

10 A. N. of Cross Plains, 
Home, Well , Trees, $28,000. 

145 A. on Hwy. 36 has Creek, 
Deer, Turkey, $300. 

W. H. BILL VARNER 
Certified Appraiser, Abilene 
(915) 672-5658 - 677-8643 

•	 
✓ House & 5A. at Cottonwood, 
$18,000. 
•••• 31 A. Cottonwood, good 
water, $25,000. 
.••• 3 bdrrn., 1 bath on 30.94 
acres, costal, stock tank, 
$32,500. 
•••• 52.75 A., house, trees, good 
hunting, $28,500. 
p✓ Buildingandlotintown,$5,000. 
✓ 3 bdrm., 1 1/2  bath, out 
buildings and pens, $18,500. 
✓ Lake cabin and lot on Lake 
brownwood, $16,000. 
•••• 55 Acres - Good location 
and water, $24,750. 
✓ 162 Acres, 3 bdrm, 2 bath 
home, pecan trees, born, pens, 
stock ponds, $128,000. 
✓ 3 bedroom, 1 bath, brick home, 
1 14 wooded acres, 2 water 
wells, good location, $47,000. 
0-• 4.8 Acres, water well, costal, 
Pecan Trees, near Eula, $8,000. 
✓ 69 Acres, good hunting, $385 
per acre. 

ROLAN JONES 
(817) 725-7640 

Janice Buckner Tom Buckner 
(817) 725-Z638 , 

Cross Plains, Tx. 
•  

rci  LOVIS SEPTIC 
TANK & 
BACKHOE 

SPECIAUZING IN SEWER SYSTEM 
1 INSTALLATION SERVICE. 

Clovis Simons 
(817) 725-7484 	Box 604 

L CROSS PLAINS. TEXAS j _ ..... 

CROSS PLAINS REVIEW 
(UPS 138.880) 

DON TABOR, PUBLISHER 
CROSS PLAINS REVIEW 

(UPS 138.8101 is published 
weekly on Wednesday for 
$10.00 per year within 30 
miles of Cross Plains and/or 
Callahan Couniy; 612.00 per 
year elsewhere in Texas; 
$14,00 per year out of state 
(No foreign copies except APO 
or like address); by Review 
Publishing Co. 155 E. 8th St., 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443. 
Second-lass postage paid at 
Cross Plains, Texas. 
POSTMASTER: Send addre3s  
changes to Cross Plains 
Review, P.O. Box 519, Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443. 
Telephone (817) 7254111. 

ALTO SAXOPHONE case and horn 
in excellent condition, $200 firm. Call 
7254235. 	 41-1tp 

LADIES SILVERLAKE SKIRTS -
dark denim, button front with 2 
pockets, size 3 to 13, $29.99. 
Johnson's Dry Goods. 	41-Itc 

AUTOS FOR SALE 

'84 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 
3/4 TON PICKUP - fully loaded, 
454 motor, 6' camper shell, 1 owner. 
Call (817) 725-6113. 	 41-tfc13 

ATTENTION - GOVERNMENT 
SEIZED VEHICLES from $100. 
Fords, Mercedes, Corvettes, Chevys. 
Surplus 	Buyers 	Guide. 
1-602-838-8885, EXT. A4469. 41-3m 

LIVESTOCK & PETS  

FOR SALE - Registered Red 
Brangus Bulls & Heifers, breeding age 
and younger McInnis Red Brangus, 
Rt. 1, Box 122, Cross Plains, TX 
76443, (817) 725-6591. Call before 8 
a.m., at noon or night. 	40-2tc 
REGISTERED SIMBRAH BULLS 
for sale (3/4 Simmental and 1/4 
Brahma) fertility tested. Morris Odom 
(817) 725-7636. 	 41-1tc 

GARAGE SALES 

THURSDAY & FRIDAY 10 a.m -
7 p.m. $1.00 Sale - Men's shirts & 
pants, picture frames, odds & ends. 
Many other items reasonably priced 
(furniture, motorcycle, weight bench 
with weights, etc.) 12th & Ave. C. 

41-1tp 

TO GIVE AWAY 

FREE GOOD FIREWOOD under 
certain conditions. Call (817) 
725-6591. 	 40-21c 

LOST & FOUND 

LOST TWO FEMALE BEAGLES. 
Call Jim Baum (817) 725-7372. 

41-1tp 

HELP WANTED 

ATTENTION - HIRING! Govern-
ment jobs - your area. 
$17,840-$69,485. 	Call 
1-602-838-8885. Ext. R4460. 	38.4q, 
ATTENTION: EASY WORK EX-
CELLENT PAY! Assemble products 
at home. Details. (1) 602-8384885 
Ext. W-4469. 	 40-44, 
ATTENTION: EARN MONEY 
TYPING AT HOME! 32,000/yr in-
come potential. Details. (1) 
602-838-8885 Ext. T-4469. 	4,:i.up 

SITUATIONS WANTED  

CHILDCARE in my home anytime. 
Call Robin Yarborough (817) 
725-7262. 	 41-2w 

WANTED 

WOULD LIKE TO CONTACT peo-
ple interested in an Apostolic 
Pentecostal Church. P.O. Box 431, 
Dublin, TX 76446. (817) 445-4889. 

40-4m 

CARD OF THANKS 	PUBLIC NOTICE  THREE BEDROOM HOUSE on 
water, Lake Brownwood, double car-
port, carpet, nice cabinets, laundry 
room, $20,000, 10% down, 10% in-
terest. 725-6205. 

FOR RENT 

FOR RENT: 2 br., 1 bath house, 
storage, $175 mo. Call Dora Smith, 
Broker 725-6489. 	 40-dc 

BUSINESS SERVICES  

CARPET CLEANING - Residen-
tal/Commercial, Free Estimates, Scot-
chguarding available. New Carpet & 
Vinyl sold and installed. Dub Meador 
- 725-7720. 	 2I-de 

INCOME TAX SERVICE - Office 
hours 8:30 to 5:30, except Friday 8:30 
to 12:00. Call Zella Erwin 725-6156. 

40-de 



SCHOOL 

LUNCH MENU 

ISM 

C.P. Junior High 
Boys Basketball 
Team Takes 
Consolation 

The Cross Plains Junior High Boys 
took consolation at the Rising Star 
Basketball Tournament this past 
weekend. 

The Mighty Mites opened with a 
very good game against May which 
eventually won the tournament over 
Rising Star. The Mighty Macs lost the 
May game 41-25, but was led by 
Jason Fleming with 15 points and 
Kevin Switzer with 10. 

In the consolation game the Mighty 
Mites blew out Moran 49-26. Jason 
Fleming led again with 23 points. 
followed by Kevin Switzer with 14. 

Others scoring included Justin Ter-
rill with 5, Tim Yates with 3, and 
Chad Coker and Billy Walker with 2 
each. 

The 8th grade now has a season 
record of 5 wins and 4 losses. 

Get Your 
Rackets Ready 

By CODY ODOM 

The Cross Plains High School Ten-
nis Team is ready to get cranked up for 
another year of tennis. Although 
workouts are not during school now, 
but after school, Coach McConal 
wants people who are going to play to 
start coming and practicing as soon as 
possible. 

The teams are not yet determined. 
but there are three returning players, 
Pam Glover. Candee Williams, and 
Trudy Newman. 

Competitions are to begin the first 
weekend in March at Breckenridge 
and other tournaments include: San 
Saba, Santa Anna, and Brownwood. 

Coach McConal, who has been a 
tennis coach for 13 years, hopes to 
take the District title, win first at 
Regional, and hopes some of his 
players will go to State. 

CORRECTION 
The information below was inadver-

tantly left off the Cross Plains I.S.D. 
Annual Performance Report that was 
sent to the Review. The Cross Plains 
School wishes to express an apology to 
the students and their parents for this 
error. 

Boy's Single Tennis — 1st Place 
District Meet. 

Girl's Single Tennis — District 13 
Champions. 

Girls Double Team — State 
Qualifiers. 

JANUARY 
Happy Birthday To You! 

By BECKY McKEEHAN 

Thursday, January 11 
Candee Williams — Senior 
Monday, January 15 
Marian Reed — Kindergarten 
Tuesday, January 16 
Dwayne Burch — Freshrhan 

JANUARY 15 — JANUARY 19 

(Subject to Change) 

BREAKFAST 

MONDAY — in service. 
TUESDAY 	Oatmeal. toast, 
sausage, orange juice, milk. 
WEDNESDAY — Cheese, toast, 
grape juice, milk. 
THURSDAY — Choice of ready to 
cat cereal, toast, peanut butter, honey. 
grape juice, milk. 
FRIDAY — Waffle, sausage. grape 
juice, milk. 

LUNCH 

MONDAY — In service. 
TUESDAY — Burritos w/chili, 
cheese, buttered carrots, spinach. 
pears, milk. 
WEDNESDAY — Chicken fried 
steak w/gravy, creamed potatoes. 
green beans, rolls, dessert, milk. 
THURSDAY — Beef Taquitos 
w/cheese, salad. French fries. 
chocolate pudding. milk. 
FRIDAY — Hamburger. lettuce. 
tomato. pickle. French fries, cookie. 
milk. 

CASEY WILLIAMS 
...completes first year of college football 

A Freshman Again 

Vote For a Man Who 
LYJ Will Work For 

4 	 Callahan County. 

Vote For a 
Qualified Man. 

Vote For Jon Herod For 
Callahan County Judge! 

March 13, 1990 
Pd. Pol. Ad. By Eldon Odom, Rt 1, Box $7, Baird, Tugs 

ROBERT E. tAcC001 
Attorney At Law 

Law Offices at 

235 Market St. 
Baird, Texas 79504 

11111 ITTITITTITTITTIT1111 fri11111 

PH. 725-6424 
111E111111111111111111 	IIHHfl 

Your better health Is our concern. 

NF %I. I)Rti; 

(915) 854-1016 

SENSITIVE TO COLD 

Those who often feel cold may he deficient in iron 
When exposed to cold, normally the thyroid gland 
pumps Out more hormone, which stimulates the hody 
cells to produce more heat. Iron deficiency inhibits this 
thyroid response Women, because of the loss of iron 
with menstruation, tend to he iron deficient If very sen 
sitive to cold. consult your doctor or pharmacist about 
iron supplements 

r.  

Weekly Health Tip 

By CA/BM/LW 

Ready for a break and eager to see 
his family and friends, Casey 
Williams, a 1989 graduate of Cross 
Plains High School, arrived home for 
the holidays after having finished his 
first college semester and his first year 
of college football. In his senior year 
in high school, Casey was selected as 
an All-State linebacker and before the 
year was over, he was recruited and 
signed with Porterville College in 
Porterville, California under a football 
scholarship. Since he left for Califor-
nia last August, he has been very busy 
with football, classes, and a part-time 

job. 
According to Casey, college foot-

ball is different than high school ball. 
For one thing he says, "They hit a lot 
harder!" Casey played as a defensive 
tackle and used on both the kickoff and 
punt return teams. He felt quite for-
tunate that out of the 40-member team 
(35 of which were freshman) he was 
able to play in all but one game, and 
by the middle of the season he had 
earned a starting position. Casey, 
6'1", also said that he happens to be 
one of the smallest of the defensive 
linemen and his playing weight was 
220 pounds. 

In a written statement, Casey's 
defensive line coach, Mark 
Hedgecock, said that he (Casey) has 
shown "outstanding qualities as a 
player, a student, and a person." 
Hedgecock goes on to say that 
"Casey's hard work and determina-
tion have made him one of our best 
defensive linemen." Even off the 
field, Casey has "with his friendly 
words gained the respect of his fellow 
team members and other classmates," 
says Hedgecock who finished his 
statement by saying Casey has 
"represented his family and 

School Calendar 
By BECKY McKEEHAN 

Thursday, January 11 
Final Exams (1st, 3rd, and 5th 

periods). 
Early dismissal at 2:45 p.m. 

Friday, January 12 
Final Exams (2nd, 4th, and 6th 

periods). 
Early dismissal at 2:45 p.m. 
Varsity Basketball at 6:30 with 

Zephyr. 

Saturday, January 13 
Junior Varsity Basketball at Cisco. 

Monday, January 15 
Teachers Workday — No School. 

Tuesday, January 16 
Beginning of 2nd Semester. 
Grades turned in at 8.30 a.m. 

Wednesday, January 17 
Report cards should be handed out  

hometown of Cross Plains with honor 
and dignity. 

According to Casey when asked 
about the Porterville football team he 
said, "They could have done better, 
and next year they will do good." 
Casey does plan on playing there again 
next year since he has earned a starting 
position. 

Casey was hoping to get his old high 
school number, 73, but he said that 
was already taken, so he chose #55 
which was his father's number the 4 
years he played high school football 
and it was also his mother's number 
the years she played basketball. 
Casey's parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Gregg Williams of Cottonwood. 

In addition to his life in football, 
Casey also worked 10 hours a week in 
a part-time job as a campus security 
guard assigned to parking lots to "pro-
tect cars from burglary and giving 
parking tickets." 

Then, in his time between football 
and work, he did manage to get 3 
classes, two English classes and a 
criminology course. As of yet, he has 
not received his semester grades, but 
he says he feels he did well in the 
classes. Casey plans on majoring in 
criminology while attending Porter-
ville for 2 years, then transferring to a 
larger college to finish and hopefully 
to play football, although he is 
undecided as to where. "Maybe 
McMurry," he says. 

As with most college freshmen, it is 
their first time away from home. 
When asked if he got homesick, Casey 
said he was when he first got there, 
missing his old friends in C.P. and his 
family, and as to what he missed the 
most..."My sister." 

What he enjoys the most is. "having 
my own place and setting my own 
curfew." Casey shares an apartment 
with 2 other football players; Danny 
Turk from Youngstown, Ohio and 
Tracy McKeown from Houston 

Casey also adds that being away 
from home has "improved my attitude 
and I've grown up a lot in learning 
how to be on my own." 

Casey heads back to California for 
his 2nd semester of college and foot-
ball off-season, work, and study on 
January 14. He says he enjoys hearing 
from friends at Cross Plains, and if 
anyone would like to write him, his 
address is P.O. Box 723, Porterville, 
CA 93257. 

Don't Cry! 
By MUSTY GIBBS 

Due to the semester exams we, the 
mass media class of Cross Plains High 
School, are sorry to inform you that 
there will be no student articles in next 
week's paper, January 18. However, 
we will resume our articles the follow-
ing week, January 25. 

Isaac Newton's 3 
Laws Of Motion 

By CHARLOTTE LET NEV 

Gravitation: Newton's greatest 
achievements were his work in physics 
and celestial mechanics, which 
culminated in the theory of universal 
gravitation. Even though Newton also 
began this research in the plague 
years, the story that he discovered 
universal gravitation in 1666 while 
watching an apple fall from a tree in 

his garden is a myth. 
By 1666. Newton had formulated 

early versions of his three Laws of 
Motion. He had also discovered the 
law stating the centrifrugal force of a 
body moving uniformly in a circular 
path. However, he still beliesed that 
the earth's gravity and the motions of 
the planets might be caused by the ac-
tion of whirlpools or sortices of small 
capsules as Descartes had claimed 
Although he knew the law of cen-
tnfrugal forces, he did not have a cor-
rect understanding of the mechanics of 
circular motion. He thought of circular 
motion as the result of a balance bet-
ween two forces: one centnfrugal. the 
other centnpetal, rather than as the 
result of one force. A centripetal force 
constantly deflects the body away 
from its inertia] path in a straight line. 

Newton's great insight of 1666 was 
to imagine that the centrifrugal force 
of the moon or any planet must 
decrease as the inverse square of its 
distance from the center of its motion. 
For example, if the distance is double, 
the force becomes one-fourth as much. 
If distance is tripled, the force 
becomes one-ninth as much. This 
theory agreed with Newton's data 
within about 11 percent. 

Junior High Boys 
Victorious Over 
Moran 

The Cross Plains Junior High Boys 
Basketball Team improved its season 
record to 6 wins and 4 losses with an 
easy 50-9 win over Moran. 

The Mighty Mites were led by 
season scoring leader Jason Fleming 
with 20 points, followed by Kevin 
Switzer with 7, Rodney Rudloff with 
6, and Justin Terrill with 6. 

Others contributing to the win in-
cluded Kelly Barclay with 4, Chad 
Coker with 4, and Tim Yates with 3. 
The coaching staff wants to recognize 
Billy Walker for his outstanding 
defensive play and hustle. 

College Hotline 
By CA 

With the school year half over 
already, and many seniors (and even 
some juniors) making plans for col-
lege, the Texas Association of College 
Admission Counselors (TACAC) is 
providing a unique service for the se-
cond year in a row. 

They are providing a toll-free 
telephone HOTLINE to answer ques-
tions about the sometimes confusing 
and frustrating information needed in 
getting ready for college. 

A wide variety of information is 
available relating to topics such as ad-
mission procedures, financial aid, 
scholarships, deadlines, campus hous-
ing, etc., etc. 

Available to any Texas resident, the 
COLLEGE INFORMATION 
HOTLINE will be in operation on: 
Saturday, January 13 and Sunday, 
January 14, from 10 a.m. to 6 p.m. 
The special toll-free number is: 
1-800-253-8989. 

According to information received 
from TACAC, over 1,000 calls were 
answered in last year's HOTLINE 
event. In addition to the help provided 
over the telephone, requests can be 
made for information to be mailed to 
the caller directly from the colleges 
Last year, there were even out-of-state 
colleges that sent information. 

Make plans now to call the COL-
LEGE INFORMATION HOTLINE. 
Prepare your questions in advance. If 
the lines are busy, keep trying! 

Student Council 
Met January 3 

By KARMEN KEY 

On January 3, 1990. the Student 
Council of Cross Plains High School 
met. Among topics discussed was the 
planting of trees around the school 
campus. During the meeting it was 
decided that trees were to be ordered 
from the Arbor Day Foundation, and 
the order has been made. 

According to Don Sibley, Student 
Council President, there were 10 trees 
ordered. As of yet, they have not 
decided exactly where the trees will be 
planted. But wherever they will be, 
they will be an asset to the school cam-
pus.  

Oh 'Know!' 

B JENNIFER GOBLE 

As the semester comes to an end, the 
students of Cross Plains High School 
prepare for semester exams Exams 
will be closed campus this scar, and 
they will last two hours each class. 

The tests started Wednesday . 
January 10. and will end Fnday 
January 12. The students will get out 
of school at 2 45 p m each day 

Not only do the students have to take 
semester exams. they will be taking 
six weeks tests Six weeks tests have 
become mandatory by the state after 
the TEA's visit 

Monday , January 15. will be a 
school holiday for the students because 
it is a faculty workday The new 
semester will start Tuesday . January 
16. leaving only 88 days until another 
summer vacation 

BURKETT NEWS 
By LOVERA STR1CKLA.ND 

Merle Amos, her husband. Gene. 
and their three sons. Michael. Scott) 
and Toby of Yellow Pine. Idaho 
visited her parents. Andrew and Dons 
Walker. Darryl Walker and family of 
Nimrod Community, Dons' brother. 
Robert and his wife of Winters, Bro. 
and Mrs. Ted Bigham of Bradshaw. 
and Walter and Melba Walker also 
visited Dons and Andrew. 

Many and Glenda Callaway are the 
proud parents of a new son. Joseph Jay 
was born December 28, 1989 and 
weighed 6 pounds, 10 ounces. and has 
a full head of hair. He has an older 
brother, Brooke. 

Lorene Price of Potosi and Leann 
Burleson and children of Abilene 
visited Glenda Callaway and J.J. 
Saturday afternoon. They also visited 
the Dalton Goulds. 

Oscar and Edna Gould of Coleman 
visited Dalton and Lucille Gould Sun-
day afternoon. They also visited the 
Marty Callaway family. 

B.L. Strickland of Midland is spen-
ding a few days visiting W.B. Blud-
worth and others in the Burkett area. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jody Whitley of San 
Saba visited Lat Mountain and Jack 
and Lovera Strickland Saturday after-
noon. 
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10 Free Trees From 
Arbor Day 
Foundation 
Ten tree trees will be fasen to each 

person who joins The National Arbor 
Day 	Foundation during January . 
1490.  

The free trees are pan of the non-
profit Foundation's Trees for America 
campaign 

The ten trees are the Sugar Maple. 
White Flowering Dogwood. Pin Oak. 
White Pine. Red Maple. Birch. 
American Redbud, Silver Maple. Red 
Oak. and Colorado Blue Spruce 

"These trees were selected to pro-
side benefits ever season of the year 
lovely spring flowers. cool summer 
shade. spectacular autumn colors. and 
winter tvemes and nesting sites for 
songbirds... John Rosenoa . the Foun-
dation's executive director. said 

The trees will be shipped postpaid at 
the nght time for planting between 
February 1 and May 31 with enclosed 
planting instructions The six to 
twelve inch trees are guaranteed to 
grow or they will be replaced tree of 
charge 

To become a member of the Foun-
dation and to receive the free trees, 
send a S 10 membership contribution to 
TEN TREES. National Arbor Das 
Foundation. 100 Arbor As enue. 
Nebraska City. NE 68410. by January 
31. 1990. 

Correction 
Editor's Note: The following para. 
graph is corrected from last week's 
county office filing by county judge 
candidate Jon Henad that appeared in 
the Cross Plains Review. The newspa-
per apologizes for the error.  

Jon Herod has built his life around 
public service to his community. He is a 
deacon at the Clyde Church of Chnst 
and stated, "My first pnonty is to sers c  
the Lord." He is also currently a trustee 
on the Clyde School Board: current 
president of the Goodfcllows of Clyde 
which serves the disadvantaged: imme • 
date past president of the Ki wants Club 
of Greater Clyde; past president and 
current board member of the Clyde 
Chamber of Commerce: an active 
member of the ClydeParent Teacher 
Club; and past treasurer and director of 
the Clyde Jaycees. 

C.P. STUDENT REVIEW  
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EVERY MONDAY IS 
SENIOR CITIZENS DAY 

—5% DISCOUNT ON 
YOUR TOTAL PURCHASES 

EXCLUDING CIGARETTES 

STORE HOURS 
MONDAY - SATURDAY, 7 A.M. - 8 P.M. 

SUNDAY, 8 A.M. - 7 P.M. 

..S67 

WE ACCEPT 
FOOD STAMPS 
& WIC CARDS 

We Have 
Money Orders 

Postage Stamps 

SLICED 
BACON 

GOOCH 
1 LB. PKG.  

$ 1 49 

LIGHT & LEAN 
FRANKS 

HORMEL 
1 LB. PKG. 

$1 89 

GERMAN 
SAUSAGE 

GOOCH 
12 OZ. PKG. 

$1 19 

WILSON 
MEAT 
BOLOGNA $1 LB. PKG. 1.79 

) MIRACLE WHIP 
32 OZ.  

$ 1 69  

CAKE MIX 
BETTY CROCKER SUPERMOIST 

YELLOW, WHITE, OR DEVILS FOOD 
18.25 OZ. BOX 

99c 
WOLF CHILI 19 07 CAN 

99c 

I !MY 

DR. PEPPER 
2 LITER 

$ 1 29  

PRINGLES POTATO CHIPS ♦ 
7 OZ., ALL FLAVORS 

29 

6 

Phone 725-7131, 

WEEK LONG SPECIALS 
SAVE THIS AD, SHOP ANY DAY YOU LIKE—
SPECIAL PRICES IN THIS AD EFFECTIVE 

JANUARY 10 thru JANUARY 16, 1990 
Cross Plains, Texas 	 We Have Postage Stamps & Money Orders 

DOUBLE COUPONS 7 DAYS A WEEK 

WILSON 
MEAT FRANKS 
ADVANCE BREADED 
STEAK FINGERS 

,200pkG 99c 	LOUIS RICH 

$1.49 

 
TURKEY 

12 OZ. PKG. $ 1 79 

APPLES „„“,„._„...0_, 
TOMATILLOS FRESH 

APPLES 
WASHINGTON X-FANCY RED DELICIOUS 

3 LBS.1$1 PEAR 8.s...1 
3 LBS. FOR 

SHURFRESH NAVEL 
	

SI 69  

5LBs1$1 

2..BAG59c FRUIT DRINKS... 5!$1 

VW'S 
NO BEANS 

.79c CARROTS FRESH 

ORANGES 5 LB. BAG 

L.69c ONIONS,. 

BETTY CROCKER 
FROSTING MIXES 

16 OZ 

NABISCO, 12 OZ. 
NILLA WAFFERS 
SUNSHINE, 1 LB. 
CHEEZ-IT CRACKERS 
LIPTON, 3 OZ. 
INSTANT TEA 
TURTLES, 12.5 OZ. 
CEREAL 

$1.79 
51.99 
52.99 
	$1.99 
N 	t 	 

99c 

CHERRY PIE 
FILLING 

LUCKY LEAF 
22 OZ.  

FRISKIES, 6 OZ. 
CAT FOOD 
PALMOLIVE, 12 OZ. 
DISHWASHING LIQUID 
VANISH 

41$1 
89c 
79c 
69c 

CHOCOLATE 
CHIPS 

PARADE SEMI-SWEET 
12 OZ. 

BOOTH BREADED, 12 04 n n  
FANTAIL SHRIMP 	J. 0 
SHEDD'S, 3 LB. $1 COUNTRY CROCK 	 69  
NIGHT 
FAJITAS

HAWK, 131/2  OZ. 
BEEF OR CHICKEN  

89c 
CREAM OF 

MUSHROOM SOUP 
CAMPBELL'S, 1016 OZ. 

2189c 

HILLS BROTHERS COFFEE 
13 OZ. 

$ 1 99  RED CAN ... 
13 OZ. $299 
DECAF 	 
8 OZ. $'a 99 
INSTANT ..   

DROP-INS 
BRAWNY 
TOWELS 

9c 

8 OZ. 
COOL WHIP 

Gmpkdi 

Cream o} 
Mushroom 
*SOM.* 

ZEE NICE-N-SOFT 
TOILET TISSUE' 	 

4 ROLL PACKAGE 

PURINA 
DOG CHOW 

25 LB. BAG 

DISHWASHING 
LIQUID 

DAWN, IVORY, OR JOY 
32 OZ. BOTTLE 

TIDE, 136 OZ. 
DETERGENT 

REGULAR, UNSCENTED, OR 
WITH BLEACH 

99c 
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