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Cross Plains' First 
Mural Is Complete 

Many Remember Immigrant 
Merchant Here In Long Ago' 

EDITOR'S NOTE: Jack Scott, 
former publisher and editor of the 
Cross Plains Review, recollects early 
merchant in the community as this 
week's guest writer. 

LOVELY YARD — The yard of 
Gene and Norma Foster is beautifully 
landscaped as it is almost continually 
shaded by the large trees. Most plants 

came from starts from other people's 
yards. Now Norma likes to return the 
favor. 

FINISHED PRODUCT — The Com-
munity Mural is now complete! If you 

millions of purple bachelor buttons 
and cocks combs. 

SURROUNDED WITH FLOWERS 
— This dinner bell is in the center of 

haven't already noticed, drive down 
Main Street and see the fantastic 
resemblance of Hub Freeman and his 
blacksmith shop. Jamie Lankford did 
an incredible task of capturing the man 
and the art of blacksmithing in the 
mural. Hub said, "It just suits me ex-
actly." He seemed very pleased with 
the work. Jamie said she probably had 
met everyone in town by now, because 
so many interested people stopped to 
admire the painting. It is truly 

something our community can he pro-
ud of. and it would be nice to have 
more painted on empty building sides. 
Soon people will slow down as they 
pass through our little town and take 
notice. I have heard comments of 
children about the fact that "our town 
is beginning to look so good." If you 
would like to be a part of this adven-
ture, please make your contributions at 
the Citizens State Bank. Help the pro-
gress continue! 

Scout Leaders Needed 

Back during the 1920's and 30's 
Cross Plains had a little Lebanese dry 
goods merchant named Cecil A. 
Lotief. He was undoubtedly one of the 
most unusual individuals ever to live 
and do business here. 

Cecil had emigrated to America 
when only a teenage boy. He learned 
to speak the language while walking 
across East Texas peddling needles, 
thread and similar wares, which he 
carried in a pack on his back. When 
not invited to spend the night with 
some farm family he would sleep in a 
barn, under a bridge, or whatever 
shelter was available. He was actually 
taught to read by school children in 
homes where he visited. If they taught 
him well he would often ask to hang 
around for a week or so, helping with 
farm chores to earn his keep and stu-
dying with the chidren at night. 

After a few years he had saved and 
learned enough to buy a horse and a 
hack to transport his enlarged stock of 
merchandise. His business was 
somewhat a forerunner of the Watkins 
and Rawleigh Route peddlers that 
came on a few years later. All the 
while, though, he continued to study 
with children in homes he called upon 
and before long he was reading 
newspapers and comprehending the 
language rather well. 

From his first days of peddling, 
though, Cecil's ambition had been to 
one day own a store and be a full-
fledged merchant. That day arrived for 
him almost simultaneously with the 
discovery of oil in the Cross Plains 
country. He came here, rented a Main 
Street store building and stocked it 
with family dry goods. The venture 
prospered and Cecil and his Lebanese 
bride bought a little house and started 
their family. Two of their children — a 
set of twins — are buried in the local 
cemetery. 

Most everybody traded in their 
hometown in those days and although 
there were three dry goods stores here, 
Lotief did a booming business. His 
store most always had a sale in pro-
gress. He advertised regularly in the 
Cross Plains Review and subscribers 
read every word of them. Not only did 
Cecil cut his prices but his advertising 
was like reading the funny paper. 
When he slashed the price on men's 
trousers he would caption his ad with 
something like this: "Lotiefs Pants 
are Coming Down." If it was ladies 
lingerie he was pushing, the heading 
might read: "Ladies Underwear Half 
Off at Lotief's." Women of the town 
frowned upon the suggestive wording 
but privately they were said to have 
chuckled and whispered to one 
another, "Have you read Lotiefs 
ad?" 

When business slowed during the 
Depression of the 1930's, Cecil en-
trusted the store to his wife and 
became interested in politics. He made 
several races for the State Legislature 
and was eventually elected to repre-
sent Callahan and Eastland Counties. 
He mainly ran on a platform of oppos-
ing high utility rates, corporation 
lawyers and professional politicians. 
Perhaps he attracted most attention as 
a lawmaker when he succeeded in 
passing a local bill which reduced the 
salaries of Callahan County office-
holders, many of whom were thought 
to have opposed his election. 

Lotief left here shortly before the 
advent of World War II, moving his 
store to Rotan. Although he has been 
gone nearly 50 years most every old 
timer here has a favorite Lotief story 
to relate. If someone starts to tell you 
one, listen carefully. They're all fun-
ny. 

With the beginning of school just 
around the corner, the Girl Scouts are 
gearing up- for fall activities also. 
Brownie Play Days, Junior Cam-
porees, leaders' training, monthly 
leaders' meetings, interested girls —
everything is ready — except adult 
leadership! 

Teresa Koenig and Netha Carouth 
will again be working with the Junior 
Scouts. Cadette and Senior Leaders 
are Frances Whitely and Lynette 
Gomillion. 

The big leadership gap is at the 
Brownie Girl Scout level. There are 

Giggle, Giggle? 
Well, if you are wondering what this 

is all about, the Cross Plains Review is 
going to feature a humorous story or 
joke each week. So all you Yarn spin-
ners and comedians its your turn to 
shine! Just remember it must be in 
good taste and be really funny. 

Esthloy Dickson will start off this 
new venture with her rendition: 

The preacher told about this woman 
who had been bitten by a rabid animal. 
She waited so long to go to the doctor, 
she had become rabid herself — the 
doctor asked for a list of people he 
should notify. 

She began writing names — She 
wrote a long list — the doctor asked 
"Am Ito notify all these people?" She 
said, "No, they are people I'm going 
to bite!" 

If you would like to submit a com-
ical story, etc, please bring it by the 
Review office by Friday of each week 
or mail it to: Cross Plains Review, 
P.O. Box 519, Cross Plains, Texas 
76443. All material will be edited as 
deemed necessary. Hanging baskets and colorful 

caladiums add to the peaceful at-
mosphere. 

SHADED BACK YARD — The 
swing is currently being used by the 
Foster's large black cat named Blue. 

about 12 first graders interested in one 
troop and approximately 15 second 
and third graders in another group. 
Numerous working women have 
volunteered to help with special events 
and weekend outings, but without the 
definite weekly leadership there will 
be no troops. 

Training is available and experienc-
ed leaders arc willing to help in an ad-
visory role, so it shouldn't he a totally 
scary task to become a "very special 
person." Women or husband/wife 
teams interested in helping little girls 
have fun and to grow in positive ways 
may contact Arlene Stephenson at 
725-6879 for more information. 

Yard Of The Week Remembering Prof 
BY VANDA KING 

Editor O.B. Edmondson will he roasted on 
Saturday, September 10, at the Cross 
Plains Community Center from 6 to 
7:30 p.m. This event is sponsored by 
the Callahan County Cancer Society. 

Those of you who arc not doing the 
roasting, and would like to participate, 
please send in your favorite "Prof 
Bloopers" to be shared with others. 

You may mail these humorous tales 
or memories to Susan Sharpe, Box 68, 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443 or Aimee 
Keele, Rt. 1 Box 11, Cross Plains, 
Texas 76443. 

monkey grass to grow well. She 
stated, "If you will mow your monkey 
grass down the first of spring, it will 
come back healthier, taller, and much 
thicker." Lots of people have monkey 
grass around the community and they 
might enjoy that tip. 

The half barrels out front and along 
the curved drive were filled with 
geraniums and moss. A plant rack on 
the front porch displayed several 
baskets of pepperoni and purple pas-
sion, a plant that resembles fantasia 
but the under side of the leaf turns pur-
ple. 

Dwarf cannas in pink, white 
periwinkles, yellow marigolds, purple 
and variegated purple and white 
petunias, nandina bushes, climbing 
red roses, and lots of purple jew 
ground cover are seen in the front 
flower bed. Rounding the corner of the 
house on the south, you will find 
chrysanthemums, geraniums, red 
roses, cocks combs, pink gladiolas, 
petunias, marigolds, and more purple 
jew. 

Athletic Booster 
Club Meeting 

The Athletic Booster Club will be 
meeting Monday, August 29, at 7:30 
p.m. at the Cross Plains School 
Library. Top priority on the agenda 
will be plans for the Homecoming. 

The Booster Club will he selling 
bandanas, t-shirts, and caps in support 
of the Buffalo football team. The ban-
danas are available now and the 
t-shirts and caps will be in around 
September 5. Contact a member of the 
booster club if you would like to order 
any of the items. 

A spokesman of the club stated that 
they would appreciate everyone com-
ing to the meeting and participating. 

First Grade Orientation 
Parents of incoming First Graders 

are invited and urged to attend a pre-
registration and orientation session at 
7 p.m. Tuesday, August 30. The 
meeting will be held in the Cross 
Plains Elementary School Library. 

This session will give parents and 
teachers a chance to get acquainted, to 
register the children, and to discuss 
First Grade subjects and activities for 
the 1988-89 school year. Mrs. Wilson, 
Mrs. Sowell, and Mr. Womack will be 
available to answer questions from 
parents. 

The outstanding yard, belonging to 
Gene and Norma Foster in the Pioneer 
Community, will be the final feature 
of the year. This striking place will 
catch your eye just driving down the 
road. 

Their beautiful brick home is 
located just behind a group of seem-
ingly perfectly placed post oaks with a 
lush green lawn. Around the base of 
several of the trees is a circle or 
oblong shaped bed edged with monkey 
grass blooming with tiny purple 
flowers and veneca, a ground cover, 
filling the entire bed. 

With a yard this large, these ground 
covers eliminate more mowing and 
make a pretty well-kept looking addi-
tion. The ground cover grows very 
fast, as one bed was only a year old 
and was completely covered. The 
older ones were really thick and heavy 
with the green covering. Red and 
white caladiums were growing in bar-
rels in the center. 

Norma shared a secret for getting 

LAKEWOOD NEWS Bonfire Time 
The Cross Plains Ex-Student 

Association Bonfire Committee is ask-
ing the Cross Plains High School 
classes to collect the wood for the 
Homecoming Bonfire. All wood must 
be piled at the Bonfire location, behind 
Cross Plains Grain and Peanut, in 
order to be judged. 

A cash prize will be given for the 

A great tournament is coining up 
next weekend at Lakewood Recreation 
Center on August 27 and 28. A Gu:,:s-
N-Dolls Scramble will be held fe tiur-
ing cash prizes and a meal for all par-
ticipants on Saturday night. Entry fees 
are $70 per team and tee-oft will be at 
8:30 a.m. and 1:30 p.m. both days. 

Call (817) 643-77c.2 or (817) 
725-6867 for reservAinli .  Continued On Page 3 Continue On Page 2 

Band Booster Sponsors 
`Get Acquainted Tea 

The Band Booster Club will be 
hosting a "Get Acquainted Tea" for 
all teachers, faculty and band parents 
in the band hall Tuesday, August 30, 
from 6:30 to 8 p.m. 

Everyone is invited to attend and get 
to know one another better. 

Another great year is anticipated by 
the Cross Plains Buffalo Band, and the 
size of the group has almost doubled. 

Band Boosters hope to keep the band 
program strong and progressing with 
the assistance of parents and the in-
spiration of Randy Taylor, director. 

WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 24, 1988 



COURTHOUSE NEWS 
11S11•111111111111111111111  

OBITUARIES 
Which Businesses Must Comply 
With The New Plant Closing Law' 

COMMISSIONER 

Mary Scott 
Nabers 

TEXAS BUSINESS TODAY 

months or inure. Notice is 
....required under the mass lay-
off pros ision if: 
a. 50 or more workers at 

one site lose their jobs 
and the affected workers 
make up 33% or more of 

BONFIRE 
Continued From Page 1 

largest pile. After judging. all piles 
will be pushed together. A represen-
tative from each class is asked to con-
tact Monty Richards 725-6651. Greg 
Turner 725-7755. or Melissa Richards 
725-7212 to find out where to stack 
their wood. 

Bonnie Lasses 
Registration Held 
August 27-28 

Enrollment for the new season of the 
Bonnie Lasses will be Saturday. 
August 27, 10 a.m. - 3 p.m. and Sun-
day, August 28, 1 p.m. - 5 p.m. 
Classes begin September 6. 

Classes offered will be Tap. Jazz. 
Ballet, Aerobics, and this year a new 
class will be offered to girls ages 7-14, 
that is Cheerleading Classes with a 
qualified instructor. 

Bonnie Potter, instructor of the Bon-
nie Lasses, would like to announce the 
addition of two new student teachers 
this year. Kathy Hudson from Col-
eman has been working. all summer 
being trained and going to workshops 
to take on Jazz Classes and also to 
teach new Cheerleading Classes this 
year at the Slim Gym. Darcie Graves' 
of Cross Plains has also been \forking 
this summer being trained in Begin-
ners Tap and Ballet Classes. Bonnie 
has been attending the Academy of 
Dance at Abilene, working in sessions 
of Jazz and Ballet under Julia 
Galbraith, owner of Abilene Civic 
Ballet Company, where she will con-
tinue to attend classes this season. 

Come and join the Bonnie Lasses 
this year for a year of the newest dance 
steps and, of course, lots of fun. 

Class Of 1956 
Sets Meeting 
The CPHS Class of 1956 will meet 

at 3 p.m. on Saturday, September 10. 
The meeting will be held at the home 
of Mrs. Opal Gray, mother of Ronald 
Gray . 

Jim Byrd 
CLYDE - Jim Byrd, 68, died 

Saturday at a San Antonio hospital. 
Services were held at 2 p.m. Tues-

day at Bailey Funeral Home Chapel 
with the Rev. Louis Johnson of-
ficiating. Burial was in Ross Cemetery 
Annex in Baird. 

He was born in Brownwood, attend-
ed school there and at Cross Cut com-
munity. He was a U.S. Army veteran 
of World War II and Korean conflict. 
He was a ranch foreman in California 
and Nevada for many years. He lived 
in Clyde for several years, moving to 
Boerne in 1984. 

Survivors include his wife, Millie 
Byrd of Boerne; two sons, Jack Byrd 
of Austin and Joe Byrd of Clyde; a 
daughter, Sara Gilliam of Kansas City, 
Mo.; four sisters, Julie Badwick of 
Big Spring, 011a Belle Wilkins of 
Bronte, Beulah Wilson of Clyde and 
Alleen Whitt of Abilene; and two 
grandsons. 
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Quit smoking. 

Air Conditioning 
Problems? 

Your neighborhood 
Rheem dealer regularly 
rescues families in this 
area with the proven 
performance of Rheem 
air conditioning. For 
fast repairs or replace-
ment, call Rheem. Make 
the right choice. 

Responsive  
Defilers 

Make Rheem® 
the Right 
Choice!
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QUALITY    

ANDREWS 
REFREGERATION 
(915) 624-5544 

BURKETT, TEXAS 
COLLECT CARS ACCEPTED 

$643, 580 	 $190.536. $403,895.00 

$60.259.590 3252 366,480 

$ .6703 /3100 $ .0755 /$100, 

$ .7329 /3100 
$ .1100 /3100 
$ .8551 /3100 

$257,849,365 

$.2496/ 3100  

$.2596 /$100  
$  
$.2696 ;$100  

$  .0815 /3100 

$.0815 /3100 
$.3511 I$100  

THIS YEAR'S ROLLBACK TAX RATE: 
Last years adjusted operating taxes 
(after subtracting taxes on lost property 
and taxes to correct appraisal roll errors 
and adding taxes lost in court suits) 

+ This years adjusted tax base 
(after subtracting taxes on new property) 

= This year's effective operating rate 
x 1.08 
= This year's maximum operating rate 
+ This year's debt rate 
= This year's rollback rate for each fund 

This years total rollback rate 

SCHEDULE A: Unencumbered Fund Balances 
The following balances will probably be left In the unit's property tax accounts at the end of the fiscal year. These balances are 
not encumbered by a corresponding debt obligation. 

• 	

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
North Main at George Scott 	 Cross Plains, Texas 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 10:45 a.m. 
Youth Meet Sundays 	 7:00 p.m. 
Choir Practice Wednesdays 	  6:30 p.m. 

REV. KLEL OUESENBERRY, Pastor 7257377 

COTTONWOOD BAPTIST CHURCH 
SERVICES: Sunday School WHERE JESUS IS LORD' 	9:45 A.M
Morning Worship 	   11:00 A.M. 
Training Union & Youth Choir 	 6:00 P.M. 
Evening Worship 	   7:00 P.M. 
Wed. Evening Prayer Service 	 7:30 P.M. 
Sunday Choir Practice 6:00 P.M.

Plt Knox Waggoner, Pastor 	Tom Vandegriff, Music & Youth Director 

TYPE OF PROPERTY TAX FUND BALANCE 

Operating Fund 
Debt Service Fund 

258,913.00 
23,383.00 

SCHEDULE B: 1988 Debts Service 

The unit plans to pay the following amounts for long-term debts that are secured by property taxes. These amounts will 
paid from property tax revenues (or additional sales tax revenues, if applicable). 

be 

Located 
at 	CHURCH OF CHRIST Phone 

12th & Main 	 725-4117 Cross Plains 
COME WORSHIP WITH US WHERE CHRIST IS HONORED 

Sunday Morning Bible Class 	9:45 A.M. 
Sunday Morning Worship 	10:45 A.M. 
Sunday Evening Worship 	6:00 P.M. 
Wed. Evening Bible Study 	7:00 P.M. 

Come now, and let us reason together" Isiah 1:18 

Wed. Morning 
Ladles Bible Class 
(Seasonal) 10:00 A.M. 

WE WELCOME ONE AND ALL 

Cross Plains Review 2 Wednesday. August 24, 1988 

dr. 

42nd DISTRICT COURT 
Don Lane, presiding 

Civil Filings 
J&L Machine vs Sabian Corp., suit. on 

unpaid account. 

COUNTY COURT 
Mack Kniffen, presiding 

Misdemeanor Filings 
Jesse Prater, theft of property by 

check. 
Richard Casillas, evading arrest 
David Evan James, DWI. 
Steve Wade Satterfield, DWI. 

Divorce cases filed: 
Burkhalter, Patricia L. and Charles E. 

and in the interest of minor children. 
Myers, Pamela Kay and Paige 

Morton, and in the interest of minor 
child. 

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Monty Adrian Huddleston, Clyde, 

Ginger Fail Rhodes, Clyde. 

Aaron 'Buddy' Wells 
RISING STAR - Aaron "Buddy" 

Wells, 60, died Friday at an Abilene 
hospital. 

Services were held at 2 p.m. Mon-
day at Higginbotham Funeral Home 
Chapel with the Rev. Dale Jackson of-
ficiating. Burial was in Rising Star 
Cemetery. 

He was born in McCaulley and was 
a Baptist. 

Survivors include his wife, Collette 
Wells of Rising Star; three sons. 
Reginald Wells of Abilene, Gordon 
Wells of Odessa and Gary Wells of 
Midland; a brother, Harold Wells of 
Hamlin; a sister, Marian Moyer of 
Vancouver, Wash.; and seven grand-
children. 

City of Clyde vs. J.E. Mikeska, Jr., suit 
for delinquent ad valorem taxes. 

City of Clyde vs. James D. Wilkins, 
suit for delinquent ad valoren taxes. 
Callahan County vs V.A. 

Montgomery, auit for delinquent ad 
valorem taxes. 
Callahan County vs Harold Don 

Barton, suit for delinquent ad valorem 
taxes. 

the total workforce. or 
h. 500 or more workers lose 

their jobs even if that 
number does not repre-
sent a third of the 
workforce. 

Companies that fail to give 
the mandated notice will be 
required to pay each affected 
employee the equisalent of a 

day's pay plus fringe benefits 
for each day that notice was 
not gisen. Further, the com-
pany would he obligated to pay-
the local community S500 a 
day- , up to a maximum of 
S30.000. 

The Department of Labor is 
responsible for advising 
employers of their obligations 
under the new lass but has no 
enforcement authority when it 
conies to ensuring compliance. 
Any recourse sought for siola-
tions of the law must come 
from chit suits filed in federal 
court l” affected workers. 
labor unions, or communities. 

Ms. Nabers represents 
336.000 employers throughout 
Texas. If you have any ques-
tions you want answered. 
please write Commissioner 
Nabers at: TEXAS BUSINESS 
TODAY, 614 Texas Employ-
ment Commission Building, 
15th and Congress, Austin, 
Texas 78778. 

NEW VEHICLE 
Iva Mac Early, Abilene, Pont. 4 dr. 
Melissa Quiroz, Abilene, Chev. 2 dr. 
Watt M. Casey, Albany, Chev. PU. 
H.L. Rhone, Clyde, Chev. 4 dr. 
Mary Murillo, Abilene, GMC Van. 
Dell J. Brooks, Baird, Pont. 2 dr. 
Barbara J. Cutbirth, Baird, Chev .4 dr. 
Ellen McFarland, Merkel, Chev. 4 dr. 
Bobby L. Voigts, Baird, Pont. 3 dr. 
Teresa D. Dyess, Graham, Pont. 3 dr. 
A.M. Ogle, Clyde, GMC PU. 
Anne H. Woodman, Abilene, Pont. 4 

Criminal Indictments 
Sara Linda Garcia, theft over $20,000. 
Timothy Neal Collins, capital murder. 

Dear Commissioner Nabers: 
Could you find out the specif-
ics of the new plant closing 
law. I don't think it applies to 
my company but I need to be 
sure. 

- R.J. 
Baytown. Texas 

Dear R.J.: The primary 
thing to remember about the 
plant closing law is that it only 
applies to employers with 100 
or more employees. Once this 
initial criterion is met, the fol-
lowing rules apply: 
1. An employer must provide 

60 days notice of a plant 
closing which will result in 
50 or more workers at one 
site losing their jobs. Plant 
closing is understood as the 
permanent shutting down of 
a facility or the permanent 
elimination of jobs. 

2. 60 days notice is required 
for impending mass layoff. 
Layoff is defined as the clos-
ing of job positions for 6 

Presbyterian 
Church Had 
Surprise Visitors 

By KATE WATSON 

On Sunday morning members of the 
local Presbyterian Church were 
agreeably surprised with the visitation 
of Sarah Collins Emerick and her hus-
band, Lewis Emerick. No one knew 
Sarah at first. 

Sarah and her husband were united 
in marriage with her father, S.P. Col-
lins, officiating. That event was 48 
years ago in the present church 
building. The couple now live on the 
street of the Good Shepherd in Las 
Cruces, New Mexico. 

S.P. Collins was a greatly beloved 
man by everyone who knew him and 
pastorecl this church for 23 years. Bro. 
Collins resigned this church to take a 
church in Abilene. Both Bro. Collins 
and Mrs. Collins died there and were 
buried there. Two boys, Seaborn and 
James, had their own families and the 
men are both deceased now, but their 
widows live within visiting distance of 
Sarah. 

Sarah and Lewis have 3 children and 
9 grandchildren. She is the only living 
member of her father's family. She 
was a teacher and he was a 
businessman. 

Mrs. Don McCall and Mrs. 
Emerick are regular correspondents. 

Carpenter Is 
Charged With 
Murder-For-Hire 

A Washington state man was in Taylor 
County Jail facing federal murder-for-
hire charges in connection with a plot to 
kill his estranged wife. 

Kenneth Carpenter, 37, of Montesano, 
Washington, was arrested in Callahan 

County by FBI agents Thursday and 
charged with hiring two juveniles to 
murder his wife so he could collect on 
her life insurance policy, an FBI spokes-
man said. 

Carpenter was ordered held without 
bond pending his transfer back to Wash-
ington. 
Callahan County Sheriff's Office, 

along with the FBI arrested Carpenter at 
his residence on North Cherry Lane. 

The plot took place in Montesano 
during July. The charge became federal, 
however, because Carpenter traveled to 
California to find people to commit the 
murder. 

Two juveniles were hired, but the plot 
was discovered before an attack took 
place on the woman. 
Carpenter is originally from the 

Putnam, Baird, and Cisco area and re-
turned hereafter the plot was uncovered. 
The Callahan County Sheriffs Office 
assisted in the arrest, the FBU spokes-
man said. 
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1988 Property Tax Rates 
This notice concerns 1988 property tax rates. It presents information about three tax rates. Last year's tax is the actual rate 
the county used to determine property taxes last year. This year's effective tax rate would impose the same total taxes as last 
year If you compare properties taxed in both years. Compare it to the tax rate the county proposes for this year. This year's 
rollback tax rate Is the highest tax rate the county can set before taxpayers can start tax rollback procedures. In each case 
these rates are found by dividing the total amount of taxes by the tax base ( (the total value of taxable property) with adjustments 
as required by state law. The rates are given per $100. of property value. 

CALLAHAN COUNTY 

Farm-To-Market/ 
Flood Control 
Fund 

Cross Plains I.S. D. General 
Fund 

$652, 801.  

$652.801, 
$257,820,509 
$.2532 /$100  

$643,580, 

$257.849.365 

S.2496/3100, 

$407.084.34  
$98,727,00  
3408.071.611  
$65,818,001  
$ .62 /3100  

LAST YEARS TAX RATE: 

Last year's Operating taxes 
+ Last year's debt taxes 
= Last years total taxes 

Last years tax base 
= Last year's tax rate for each fund 

$193,612, 

$193,612.  
3252.427.679  
$ .0767 /$100, 

.3299 /3100  

$190.536, 3402,562.04 

Last year's total tax rate 

THIS YEAR'S EFFECTIVE TAX RATE 
Last year's adjusted taxes 
(after subtracting taxes on lost property 
and taxes to correct appraisal roll errors) 

+ This year's adjusted tax base 
(after subtracting taxes on new property) 

= This year's effective tax rate for each fund 
his year's total effective tax rate 

x 1.03 
= Maximum rate unless unit publishes 

notices and holds hearings 

BELIEVER'S FELLOWSHIP $60.259.590 3252.366.480 
Full Gmpel Chun 

East Highway 36 
Sunday School 	  9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	  10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	  6:15 p.m. 
Wednesday Night Bible Study & Prayer 	  7:30 p.m. 

Charlie Fortenberry, Pastor 725-6607 

$ .668 /3100 $ .0755  
$ .3251 /3100 

$ .688 /$100 $.3349 /3100 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
10TH & MAIN 	 CROSS PLAINS 	(817) 725-7629 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 11:00 a.m. 
Church Training 	  6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	 7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Prayer Service 	 7:15 p.m. 

Michael Hale, Pastor- 725-7556 	 Marvin Saunders, M/Y Dlr.-725-7550 

Principal or 
Contract Payment 

To be Paid 

Interest 
to be paid 

Description of 
Debt 

School Building 
1980 Bond $50,000 00 	 $29,713.00 

Total required for 1988 debt service 

- 	Amount (if any) paid from funds listed in 
Schedule A 

Other Amounts 
to be paid 

    

Total 
Payment 

$200 00 	 $79,913 00 

 

79.913.00 

   

   

10 967.00 

  

    

1 946 00 

     

  

67.000.00 

   

   

.00 
67,9S CI Q 

 

Ex ess collections last year 
Total to be paid from taxes in 1988 
Amount added in anticipation that the unit will 
collect only 100% of its taxes in19 
Total Debt Service Levy 

..afr 

This notice conialns a summary of actual effective and rollback tax rate calculations. You can Inspect a copy of the fu,l 
calculations at Callahan County Tax Office. 
Names of Person preparing this notice Wauneta Estes 
Title Tax Assessor-Collector 
Date Prepared August 1, 19)38 

The hermit crab's home is an 
empty sea snail shell. When the 
crab grows too big for the shell, it 
hunts for a larger one. 



Homecoming Mums 
Come In And See Our New Items And Make 

Your Selection Early. 
We Have Several Different Things To Chose From 

That We Haven't Shown Before. 
Come Early For Best Selections. 

c_71/771,  L9Z0-fed 

Box 278 	 TIM DILLARD Cross Plains, Texas 76443 
Bus. Ph. 1817) 7256220 	 Res. Ph. (817) 7256391 

GET THE NEW 
CHICKEN 

FILLET BASKET 
CREEP, 

CHEEP, CHEAP 
'299* 

Four tender n' delirious chicken fillet strips. 
Marty of hies. Tens toast And seamy country gravy. That's the new 

CHICKEN FILLET BASKET from Daily Queen. 
And ifs on sale now—cheap! 
EXPIRES AUGUST 28,1988 

THIS IS COUNTRY DO 
/t Reg. TM Tex. D.O. Op. Coon. A Req TM Am O.O. Corp. - 1988 Tot 0 Q. Op Coon. *At parbeipaung Deny Queen stores 

THE REAL DANGER OF THE DEFENSE PROCUREMENT SCANDAL 
Cross Plains Review 3  

Wednesday, August 24, 1988 Planning State's Water Needs Requires Cisco Junior College 
Has Coleman Classes Toward Fiscal Responsibility Eye 

Cisco Junior College will offer two 
classes in Coleman this Fall. Classes 
to be offered are History 113 —
History of U.S. to 1865 and English 
113 — English Composition and 
Rhetoric. Registration will be held at 
Coleman High School on August 30 at 
6 p.m. 

History will be taught on Thursdays 
from 6:30 — 9:30 p.m. and English 
will be taught on Tuesdays from 6:30 
— 9:30 p.m. 

You may register in Cisco at the Ad-
missions Office from 'August 31 
through September 15, Monday 
through Friday, 8 a.m. — 4 p.m. 

For further information, call the 
Cisco Campus at (817) 442-2567. 

The longest winter in the solar 
system is 21 years long and occurs 
on the south polar regions of Uranus. 
The temperature then is estimated 
to be minus 362 degrees Fahrenheit. 

in plenty of time for me to review their 
recommendations for legislative action 
during the 1989 Legislature. 

No one knows Texas' water needs 
better than Texans. That's why recent 
developments on another front are so 
encouraging. 

Political subdivisions in Texas, 
dating back to 1972, built their wastewa-
ter treatment works with the help of the 
federal Construction Grant Program. But 
the program financed only portions of 
the construction and the money was lim-
ited. 

Last year, Congress agreed to 
phase out the system and replace it with 
a low-interest loan process, known as the 
State Water Pollution Control Revolving 
Fund. 

Volunteer Fire 
Department Reports 
Donations 

Texas took the lead in applying 
for the federal grant to operate the fund. 
Earlier this year the Texas Water Devel-
opment Board received more than S105 
million from the U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency—one of the first 
grants awarded nationally for the pro-
gram. 

By Governor William P. Clements, Jr. 

The residents of land-locked Lub-
bock and flood-prone Houston may be 
separated by hundreds of miles, but they 
are united in a desire that state govern-
ment address Texas' water needs in a 
thoughtful, reasoned manner. 

And those needs are as varied as 
the Texas landscape. 

In some portions of the state the 
concern focuses on the development of 
sufficient water supplies to meet the de-
mands of the 21st century. 

Some Texas communities want 
more attention given to flood control and 
wastewater treatment efforts. Other mu-
nicipalities in Texas are expressing con-
cern about the quality—and quantity—of 
Our state's groundwater supplies. 

These are not merely local issues. 
They are state issues. The health of our 
Texas economy is measured by the vital-
ity of our local economies. 

It is imperative that we be far-
sighted, not short-sighted, in addressing 
these needs. We must be efficient in 
responding to these needs both on a gov-
ernmental arid fiscal level. 

Efforts to improve state govern-
ment in this regard are well underway on 
two fronts. 

Earlier this year I signed an exec-
utive order establishing the Committee 
on Water Resources Management. This 
11-member panel is being chaired by 
Walter Cardwell III of Austin, and in-
cludes members appointed by Lt. Gov. 
Bill Hobby and House Speaker Gib 
Lewis. 

Members of this committee are 
closely examining the organization and 
structure of the state's myriad water 
agencies to ensure that our water devel-
opment and water conservation and wa-
ter regulation efforts are as streamlined 
and effective as possible. 

The committee's final report will 
reach my desk by the end of the year— 

I t represents an unprecedented 
transfer of oversight for management of 
water pollution financing from the fede-
ral government to the state. 

The federal grant, plus a required 
20 percent state match, gives our perpet-
ual fund more than 5126 million for this 
fiscal year. During the next six years, 
additional federal funding is expected to 
push the amount to about $720 million, 
plus any earned interest. 

Through this program we can 
shore up the wastewater treatment needs 
of communities across our state. In doing 
so, we can help create new jobs to spur 
our economic recovery. 

With this type of fund Texas can 
finance portions of treatment facilities 
that were ineligible under the previous 
grant program. We can meet a greater 
share of our anticipated capacity needs, 
which is vital to our continued economic 
development. 

BONNIE 
LASSES 

REGISTRATION 
Enrollment for New 

Season of the 
Bonnie Lasses 

Saturday, August 27 
10 a.m. — 3 p.m. 

Sunday, August 28 
1 p.m. — 5 p.m. 

Classes 
Will Begin 

September 6 

Classes Includes: 
* Tap 	* Ballet 
* Jazz 	* Aerobics 
* Cheerleading 

Cheerleading Class 
New Addition — 
Offered to Girls 

Age 7-14 
With 

Qualified Instructor 

For more than a month, the 
American public has been hearing 
allegations of how some corrupt in-
dividuals obtained sensitive infor-
mation about Pentagon contracts. 
The charges are serious, with billions 
of dollars of contracts potentially 
tainted by the insider information 
network. 

Everyone agrees that if the alle-
gations prove true, these corrupt 
individuals must be punished for 
their crimes. But the potential 
damage to America's defenses is 
much deeper and more serious 
than the scandal itself. 

There are two very real dangers 
for America as a result of the scandal. 
First, it could change how Americans 
view those who work in the defense 
world—be it in industry or in the 
government. It is hurting the morale 
and reputation of millions of loyal 
men and women in uniform and the 
dedicated civil servants who serve 
their country well. And it is hurting 
the hard-working people in the de-
fense industry who take great pride 
in the contribution they are making 
toward maintaining national secur-
ity. The great majority of those who 
work in the defense establishment 
are helping to keep America strong 
and free—it is only the corrupt few 
who are part of the current scandal. 

Second, a group of professional 
"Pentagon-bashers" see the scandal 
as yet another excuse to try to cut 
the defense budget. It is well to re-
member that defense spending 
must be based upon the threat to 
American security. Those who are 
trying to cut the defense budget are 
wrong because this procurement 
scandal has not changed the threat 
one iota. The Soviets, in short, do 
not have any fewer tanks, fighter 
planes or pieces of artillery as a re-
sult of the scandal. 

Making this reality even worse 
is the fact that cuts in the defense 
budget will mean that the American 
people will be getting less defense 
for their defense dollar—less "bang 
for the buck." Why is this? Wild 
fluctuations in defense spending 
mean that money is wasted because 
programs do not have the steady 
funding necessary to produce weapons 
at an efficient rate. 

Two things are critical as the 
Justice Department investigates 

Cross Plains Volunteer Fire Depart-
ment received donations totaling $500 
in July and the first part of August. 
The following donations were given 
by: James McKoy $50; Gerald and 
Lela Foster for Jaws of Life $50; First 
Baptist Church Esther Sunday School 
Class in memory of Veda Milam $15; 
Annie Lee Pancake $25; Germania 
Farm Mutual for Joe C. Golson fire at 
Burkett $50; Mr. and Mrs. Joe Ingram 
$50; R.R. Production, R.O. McCarty 
and Richard Wilson $200; Mr. and 
Mrs. J.R. Morrow Jr. $50; and Mr. 
and Mrs. Dale Gary in memory of 
Weldon Gary $10. 

Total expenses on the fire truck as of 
August 20, 1988 is $18,458.42. In-
debtedness remaining on the truck is 
over $8,000. 

The department greatly appreciates 
and wishes to thank everyone for their 
support. Class Of 1973 

Meeting After 
Bonfire 

The CPHS Class of 1973 will meet 
at Terry Fortune's house Friday night, 
September 9, after the Bonfire. There 
will be signs on Highway 36 for direc-
tions. Any questions, contact Susan 
McNeel 725-7712 or Lurene McNutt 
725-6274. 

pr 
CISCO JUNIOR COLLEGE 

"SERVING THE BIG COUNTRY IN FOUR LOCATIONS 
WITH HIG QUALITY, LOW COST STATE SUPPORTED 

ACADEMIC AND VOCATIONAL PROGRAMS" 

First, government and industry 
should move quickly to identify and 
punish those greedy individuals 
who are convicted of using illegally 
obtained information to exploit the 
defense procurement process. 

Second, the American people 
should not let' the investigation 
erode America's defense. Maintain-
ing a strong defense preserves our 
ability to deter conflict—in simple 
terms, to convince an adversary not 
to test us because we have the 
means to respond to any military 
action against us. 

YARD OF THE WEEK 
Continued From Page 1 

The Fosters told me they protected 
the jew with a hay mulch in the winter. 
They drive around the round bales of 
hay and pick up the excess on the 
ground. Then a mulch is prepared and 
placed on top of the jew. 

The purple jew makes a gorgeous 
flower bed that requires very little care 
— just trim it back occasionally. Nor-
ma stated that it would take over, if 
you let it, however, 

At the back of the house is a large 
bed of purple bachelor buttons and 
magenta cocks combs. All these came 
up voluntarily and you can't believe 
the size of the bachelor button stalks. 
Of course, the cocks combs are on a 
very hearty stalk and many had split, 
making double heads with blooms. 

Across the driveway to the garage is 
another large group of periwinkles 
with crepe myrtles at each end. The 
windmill was surrounded with giant 
cannas with red and orange blossoms. 

On the north side of the house was 
red salvia, yellow princess feathers, 
periwinkles, pink and lavender impa-
tients, and giant yellow marigolds. 

The back flower bed was colorful 
with large elephant ears, purple 
striped jew, asparagus fern, several 
varieties of coleus, white and red 
caladiums. Airplane plant, fantasia, 
and fern hanging baskets contributed 
to the beauty. Caladiums and 
periwinkles grew around the tree sup-
porting the swing. 

A large sun room on the east side 
contained more ivies, red and pink 
geraniums, corn plant, Dallas fern, 
mothers-in-laws tongue, pony tail, 
aloe vera cactus, and an Easter, 
Thanksgiving and Christmas cactus. 
Gene explained how they each bloom-
ed near the time of their season. 

I discovered that many collectables 
were displayed there in the sun room. 
Norma's mother is an artist and her 
dad made the frame from barn wood. 
Many paintings were done on saw 
blades and unusual items. 

Memorabilia hang in the room from 
early days which are treasured as gifts 
from family or friends. The Fosters do 
not collect antiques, as such, they en-
joy collecting items given by friends, 
etc. which they actually used or cared 
for. 

They do collect clocks and are ex-
ceptionally proud of the grandfather 
clock the couple made together. It had 
over 250 pieces. The couple sanded 
and prepared each part and assembled 
it. 

Visiting with the Fosters was very 
interesting and I appreciated them 
allowing the Review to spotlight their 
yard. 

I would like to take this time to 
thank everyone who was featured in 
the Yard of the Week. I appreciated 
your time and cooperation and certain-
ly enjoyed the visits. 

FALL REGISTRATION 
CISCO CAMPUS 

SEPTEMBER 1 
8:30— 12, 1 — 4 & 6 — 8 

Freshman Testing & Advising (Cisco Cam- 
pus only) August 30 & 31 

CLYDE CAMPUS 
AUGUST 24 

9 — 12, 1— 4 & 6 — 8 
ABILENE CAMPUS 

AUGUST 25 
9 — 4 & 6 — 8 

COLEMAN HIGH SCHOOL 
AUGUST 30 

6 
FIRST CLASS DAY 

SEPTEMBER 6 

r 1 
Insurance Coverage 

The Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation was estab -
lished in 1933 by the U.S. Government. Congress wanted 
to make certain that the nation's money was protected 
by adequate insurance. 

A husband and wife can have insured accounts up to 
$500,000. This includes $100,000 in the husband's name; 
$100,000 in the wife's name and $100,000 in a joint 
account'. Also, $100,000 in a revocable trust with the 
husband as trustee for the wife and $100,000 with the 
wife as trustee for the husband.  

Protection 
Each depositor is insured to $100,000. This applies to 
the total funds in checking, savings, Certificates of 
Deposit and all other deposits for which a bank is legally 
responsible. 

Other Types of Accounts 
Many other types of accounts are separately covered by 
FDIC Insurance. These include IRA's, Trust Accounts, 
Corporate Accounts, etc. 

Safety Our Bank 
The basic strength of our bank lies in sound investments 
supervised by experienced and responsible 
management. The bank is examined frequently by 
accountants, insurers and government auditors. 

If you are looking for a good place to save...a secure 
place to save, you will find no safer place than our bank. 
We invite your savings and they are welcome regardless 
of size. 

*Joint Account loth the no of suro,orship 

Linens io 	 P • 

FDIC 
CITIZENS 	rnir, 

STATE BANK !MN 

FA • I...11.• 	..A ,.  P.O. Box 699 
Cross Plains, Texas 

Phone (817) 725-6141 or 
725-6142 

A 
O 

FOR FULL INFORMATION CALL: 
CISCO 817-442-2567 

ABILENE 915-698-2212 
CLYDE 915-698-5976 

COLEMAN 817-442-2567 
CALL  FOR FINANCIAL AID INFORMATION A 
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PERSONALS ************ Supplies For 88-89 
Class Of 1982 
Announces 
Reunion Site 

Kindergarten Supplies 

ra 

**********4 

Red ball point pen 
Rubber eraser 
Crayolas (24) 
Ruler 
Scissors (short points) 
Construction paper 
Elmer's Glue (School) 
Map colors 
Protractor 

MINUTE 
MUSINGS 

Visiting with Lillie McMillan last 
week were her grandson, Robert 
McMillan, and wife, Kelly of McMin-
ninville, Oregon; her son, Larmon 
McMillan, and wife, Vivian of 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma; her son, 
Marion McMillan, and wife, Jackie, 
and son, John of Graham; her 
daughter and husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Alford of May; grandson, Bob-
by Alford, and son, Danny of 
Brownwood; grandson, Tommy 
McMillan, and wife, Kathy, and 
children, Todd and !Crystal of Col-
eman; a niece and husband, Mr. and 
Mrs. Oscar Cypert of San Angelo; and 
a friend, Billie Aven and daughter of 
Austin. Mrs. McMillan reported a 
very enjoyable visit with everyone. 

*** 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Butler of Ard-
more, Oklahoma and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Butler of Alice spent the weekend 
before last with their mother, Mrs. 
Carl Marsh. 

By ESTHLOY S. DICKSON 

The Class of 1982 will be meeting in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Win-
frey, on the Cottonwood Road, 
following the Homecoming Parade. 

For more information call Bob Win-
frey at (817) 968-6872. 

2 No. 2 pencils 
8 or 16 crayons 
2 4 oz. bottles of glue 
Scissors 
1 eraser 
School box 
1 large box of Kleenex 
Backpack or totebag 
Put names on everything. Sixth Grade Supplies 

On July 5 Hubert and Celia Belew 
left for Ruidosa, New Mexico to visit 
their youngest son, Jerry Belew, and 
family. 

They returned home July 11 and on 
July 19 the couple left at 7:20 a.m. for 
Moline, Illinois. The 4th Armored 
Division was having their 42nd Reu-
nion there and Hubert was in the 22nd 
A.F.A. in World War II. 

They arrived at Emporia, Kansas at 
6 p.m. which is 545 miles away, 
where they stayed overnight. On 
Wednesday, July 20, they traveled to 
Iowa City, Iowa. They left Iowa at 
7:15 a.m. and reached Moline, Illinois 
at 9:45 a.m. 

The convention was held from July 
21 to July 24. The Belews reported a 
wonderful time and departed taking a 
different route on the return trip. 

The next destination was Charlot-
tesville, Virginia which is Hubert's 
hometown. Indianapolis, Indiana was 
the largest city they had seen and they 
remarked that the loop around the big 
city really helped. 
--ivfandiST 	tEly-  stayed at 
Athean, Ohio and traveled through 
Parkersburg, West Virginia on to 
Charlottesville. They arrived at 4:30 
p.m. and visited with Hubert's family, 
a sister, a brother, and a sister-in-law, 
and nieces and nephews for two 
weeks. 

On August 8, they started their 
journey home where they stayed in 
Dickson, Tennessee. Tuesday they 
traveled on to Hope, Arkansas and 
swung down to Bradley, Arkansas to 
spend a couple of days with Mr. and 
Mrs. Harry Bussey. 

The men were buddies in the service 
and Harry was unable to attend the 
reunion due to health problems. 

On Thursday, August 11, they 
drove to Clarksville and visited their 
oldest son, Buddy Belew. Monday, 
August 15, they returned to Cross 
Plains, tired after traveling some 
4,463 miles all together. They had 
seen some pretty country and traveled 
through eleven different states besides 
Texas. 

I hope I have better luck in contac-
ting my neighbors this week than I had 
last week — I missed so many of them. 

My very dearest friend from 
Abilene, Elvia Keck, and her lovely 
daughter-in-law, Lynda White, visited 
me on Saturday. Lynda is from the 
State of Virginia and came to Abilene 
to spend some time with Elvia. 

They took me to Odom's for lunch, 
then spent several hours otrt here with 
me. They truly made my week! 

I called both, my daughter and my 
son before I left the house on Satur-
day. It was raining in Longview. 

Sunday morning services at church 
were tremendous — I believe our 
pastor gets better every time I hear 
him! The monthly "Banner" has a 
message from our pastor — a message 
of hope, joy, inspiration. It is an addi-
tional "sermon" for the week! Also, 
the music program is just super. 
Brother Marvin sang "Bonded 
Together" — a truly great message 
there. 

I saw a good friend at the service 
station on Saturday — Charlie 
Fortenberry. I have not seen them in a 
long time. 

Mrs. Norman (Delphia) Lee called 
me early — bless her heart! A cousin 
of Mr. Lee visited them for several 
hours on Thursday of last week. He is 
Mr. Eldon Ray Lee of Fort Stockton 
— they had not heard from him in over 
a year. Their daughter, Norma Cun-
diff of Denton, called them on Satur-
day. 

Our friend, Gregg Williams, called 
one day to remind C.V. Jr. of the 
C.P.H.S. Homecoming on September 
10. Thanks, Gregg! 

Nell Fleming's news is distressing! 
Her daughter, JoVeda, and Bill Wat-
son came to visit on Sunday. They 
have just been released from the 
hospital. They had contracted hepatitis 
from something they ate at Long John 
Silver's in Amarillo. Now they have to 
take it easy and get a lot of bed-rest. 

visited with my sweet neighbor, 
Jewel Foster, at church on Sunday. 
Lucile Callaway visited her one day 
recently. Glady Sessum visited one 
day and told of her interesting trip to 
another state. Mrs. Lottie Sooter 
visited one day and helped on her 
quilting. 

Sally Roady is "just fair". Improv-
ing daily. Billie Freeman visited early 
last week and took Ms. Nettie to the 
doctor. Ms. Nettie fell one day —
blacked both eyes. She is going back 
to the doctor today (Monday). Bob and 
Sue McNeil of Baird visited them on 
Friday evening — took Ms. Nettie 
home with them — they brought her 
home on Sunday. 

Their son, George, called on Sun-
day from California — they talked for 
two hours (I'd hate to have to pay his 
phone bill!). Cindy and Charlie have 
been in and out several times through 
the week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cole Tillotson have 
been on the go a lot, but are "on hold" 
for awhile (due to the heat). When I 
called, they had already been to the 
grocery store and back. 

My young neighbors next door, 
David and Sherryl Goble, check on me 
often to make sure I am okay. I ap-
preciate their concern. I saw her pret-
ty daughter, Shawn, at Odom's on 
Saturday. 

David and Sara McGowen were in 
Brownwood yesterday where they had 
Sunday dinner with Howard and 
Charlene (his parents). Also, there 
were Garnette and Ron Bagley of 
Cross Cut, and that sweet "Danny 
Boy" McGowen of Andrews. I would 
have loved walking in on that family 
gathering! 

I called 	and Betty Beggs' 
number for an hour and got a busy 
signal. However, the operator said she 
could not hear anyone on the phone. 
I'll "ride" them later. 

Connie ICirldiam's article on Clara 
Nell Spencer was just super! I just 
wanted to ditto everything she said 
about her. 

First Grade Supplies o 
C
Y
an't

u  
Be 

2 No. 2 pencils with erasers 
1 pink eraser 
I red ball point pen (no red pencils and 
no felt tip) 
1 boxore)of Crayola brand crayons (24 or m  

1 pair of blunt scissors 
1 small box of Kleenex 
1 large bottle of Elmer type glue 
1 school box (cigar box size) 
1 totebag large enough to carry several 
books 
1 spiral notebook with at least 70 
pages 
1 colored pocket folder with brads to 
carry 3 hole paper 
2 pkgs. 9 X 12 manila drawing paper 
(not tablet-form) 
1 pkg. 12 X 18 assorted construction 
paper 
1 pkg. 9 X 12 assorted construction 
paper (not tablet) 
2 Big Chief Tablets 
Do not buy writing paper until after 
school starts. 
Put your child's name on everything! 

Buckle Up 
A reminder horn this newspaper end t he 

troopers of Ina Issas Department of Public Safety 

*** 
Visiting in the M.F. Dill home this 

past week were Mr. and Mrs. Skeet 
Walker, S.E. Paige, Eunice Starr, 
Blanche Moore, L.A. Richardson, Jay 
Kirkham, Clint Brashear, Mike 
Walker and Randy Walker. Howard 
Shanks and his grandson, Haven Carr 
of Big Spring, also stopped in for a 
visit. 

1 

Dal-Mar Energy 
Announces New 
Office Manager 

Cross Plains Auto Supply 

HYDRAULIC HOSES 
Made For Equipment Needs! 

1/4" to 1114" 
Trucks & Tractors 

838 Main 	 (817) 125-6212 

Second Grade Supplies 
Layman and Higginbottom 

Notebook paper 
Notebook 
Blue or black pens 
Pencils 
Red pens (2) 
Map colors 
Crayons 
1 package 18 X 24 construction paper 
1 package 18 X 24 manila paper 
Scissors 
Ruler — needs metric and customary. 

Sharon Gage of Clyde was hired as 
office manager to replace Debbie 
Gosnell, who resigned her position to 
accept employment with the City of 
Cross Plains. 

Sharon has just recently completed 
college with the degree of Com-
puterized Office Specialist with 
American Commercial College in 
Abilene. 

Sharon is married and has two 
children. She, as well as Gosnell, are 
the daughters of Mrs. Estalee Potter of 
this city. 

2 No. 2 pencils 
Big eraser 
Crayolas 
Glue (Elmer's) 
Scissors (pointed) 
Red pencil (checking) No pens! 
Ruler 
Water colors 
School box 
Big Chief Tablet 
Spiral notebook 
2 folders 
1 package colored construction paper 
1 package manila paper 
Kleenex (optional) 

EYE HEALTH - 

Third Grade Supplies 

Exposing the eyes to the ultraviolet (UV) 
light in sunshine can cause cancer of the iris 
— and °bap several decades, can cause the 
fens to cloud as in cataracts, and the retina to 
degenerate with failing,  vision even blind-
ness in the elderly. These bad ersi e effects can 
be avoided with sun glasses, selected with 
professional help, that block out all wave 
lengths below 400NM (nauometers). 

Crayons — at least 24 colors 
3 No. 2 pencils with erasers 
3 spiral notebooks — 81/2 " X 10" 
(60-90 pages with standard spaced 
lines) 
Loose leaf notebook paper (200-300 
sheets) 
*(No notebooks please! Use folders.) 
6 pocket folders (folders must have 
pocket) 
1-red 
1-orange 
1-yellow 
1-green 
1-blue 
1-any other color 
Red pen (not felt tip) 
White glue (like Elmer's 4 oz. 
minimum) 
Scissors (pointed) if you have a left- 
handed child please get 18ft-handed 
scissors). 
Ruler (inches and centimeters) 
Eraser-for pencils 
Kleenex — 200 count 
1 — 12" X 18" assorted colored con- 
struction paper 
1 — 12" X 18" manila paper 
1 — box water colors 

Your better health is our concern. 

HOOVER DIMENSION 1000 HOOVER, 
DIMENSION'" 1000 
Electronic 
Cleaning System 

MAN-J 'I— AUTO 

New 1988 Ford F150 Pickups in 
Stock. 6 cyl. Fuel Injected, 5 spd. , 
P.S., P.B. , Air Conditioner, Tilt, 
Cruised, Tinted Glass, Hitch Type 
Bumper, Deluxe Wheels, Super 
Engine Cooling, Swing Away Mir- 
rors, Radio and More. 
After Rebate 	Only $9,467 

electronic auto-power 

I—Pt:AFIA INOPC•T011.....,1 

ELECTRONIC 
DISPLAY PANEL 

Fourth Grade Supples 

Notebook paper 
Pocket folders (2) 
2 No. 2 pencils 
Red ball point pen 
Rubber eraser 
Crayons (24) 
Ruler 
Manila paper 
Scissors (sharp points) 
Construction paper 
White glue 
Small box — Kleenex 
Washable markers any brand (op- 
tional). 

Johnston Ford 
725-6181 

• 

• 

• 

• 
• 

 

DELUXE POWERMATIC NOZZLE CARPETING 
S 

SEE YOU IN SEPTEMBER! 

1988 C.P.H.S. 
HOMECOMING 

oncept 
OneSm 

• 
Fifth Grade Supplies HOOVER. 

Convertible 
Cleaner Notebook paper 

3 pocket folders 
2 No. 2 pencils 

• All steel handle 
• Powerful 4.A Amp. motor 
• 9 cri disposable bag 
• 2-pCSItiOn rug 14kustrrsett 

• Power DriveTm  
• Quadraflexim  Agitation 

• One-Speed Motor 

• Cord Wrap 
• Quick Er Clean 

Bag Change 
• Self•Adjusting 

Nozzle 
• Dual Handle Release 
• Brushed Edge Cleaning 

FRIDAY — September 9 
7 p.m. 	 ••••••••••• 	  Bonfire 

Pocket 
Money. 
(A can saved 
is sense earned) 

• 

• 

SATURDAY - September 10 
9 	11 a.m.....................Registration (High School) 
11 • 11:30 a.m.  	..... 	Business Meeting 

(Auditorium) 

	

11:30 an.     Lunch (Cafeteria) 

	

2 p.m.    Parade (Downtown) 

	

3 p.m.    Class Meetings 
8 p.m. 	  Football Game 

(Buffaloes VS Rotan) 

	

Following Game   Coffee (Cafeteria) 
Dance 	  Location To Be Announced 

• 

• 

Recycle your empty 
aluminum beverage 
cans at: 

Brownwood Iron & Metal 
1500 Melwood 

open Mon.-Fri. 8-12 & 1-5 & Sat. 8-12 
Call 646-7058 for current top price 

• 
• IF YOU ARE NOT THERE, YOU WILL BE MISSED! 

Ex-Student Association CROSS PLAINS, TEXAS 



Callahan-Shackelford Co. Farm Bureau 
Home-Auto-We-Disability-Annuities 

Fire-Estate Planning-IRA's-Health  Ins 
Jack "Kemal" Corn 

Career Agent Callahan-Shackelford Co. 
Land Bank Bldg. 

P 0 Box 1175 
(915) 854-1044 

Baird, Tx. 79504 

01110MCCIanCialaC°°°°°°°04 
CROSS PLAINS 

LIBRARY 
NOTES 

•00000000000000000000000) 

INCOME ELIGIBILITY GUIDELINES 

1988-89 

Family Size 

Annual: 

Free Reduced-Price 

Monthly: 

Free 	Reduced-Price 

Weekly: 

Free Reduced-Price 

1 	$ 	7,501 	$ 	10,675 

2 	10,049 	14,301 

3 	12,597 	17,927 

4 	15,145 	21,553 

5 	17,699 	25,179 

6 	20,241 	28,805 

7 	22,789 	32,431 

8 	25,337 	36,057 

Each Additional 	Family Member: 

	

$ 2,548 	$ 	3,626 

$ 	626 

838 

1,050 

1,263 

1,475 

1,687 

1,900 

2,112 

$ 	213 

$ 	890 

1,192 

1,494 

1,797 

2,099 

2,401 

2,703 

3,005 

$ 	303 

$ 145 

194 

243 

292 

341 

390 

439 

488 

49 

$ 206 

276 

345 

415 

485 

554 

624 

694 

$ 	70 
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ROVVDEN NEWS 
Breeding Family 
Reunes August 14 COTTONWOOD NEWS 

By MRS. N.V. GIBBS 

End Of Summer 
Street Dance And 

By BEVERLY BROWN 
Picnic August 27 

Summer vacation is almost over, 
and it will soon be back-to-school 
time. In the interest of good times for 
all area folks of all ages, the Parents of 
the Senior Class are sponsoring an 
End of Summer Daze Street Dance 
and Picnic on Saturday, August 27. 
The 100 Block of East Fifth Street 
(across the street from First National 
Bank of Cisco) will be roped off and 
creatively decorated by members of 
the Class of '89. 

The festivities will begin at 6 p.m. 
with volleyball games. a dunking 
booth and food. Volleyball will be 
free: hamburgers, prepared by Chef 
Brad Kimbrough, of Cisco Lions Club 
fame, and Ron Rhoades, will be $1.50 
and cold drinks .50 cents. 

As this edition of the paper goes to 
press, dunkees are being wooed to sit 
on the perch of the dunking booth, be 
bombarded with baseballs and dunked 
by you in the cool refreshing water. 
This promises to be a real treat, and 
the cost will be 3 throws for .50 cents. 

Jason Phillips, local D.J., will pro-
vide the music for the dance, which 
will be from 8 p.m. to midnight. 

A spokesperson for the Senior Class 
Parents stated there will be lots of sur-
prises, good food, and fun for 
everyone, and as usual no alcoholic 
beverages will be allowed. 

The Breeding family had their an-
nual reunion at Lytle Lake Auditorium 
Sunday, the 14th of August. An en-
joyable time was enjoyed by everyone. 

Those attending from Lamesa were 
Mrs. Ione Breeding, Ronnie, Judy, 
Ricky and Edie Watson, Elana 
Brown; from Midland were Donald 
and Frances Breeding, Dana and Jen-
nifer, Ronald and Donna Breeding, 
Cammie Breeding ; Troyce and Edith 
Breeding from Longview; 

Ardis Scrivner and Eddie Smith, 
Rickey, Tana and Shay Smith from 
Goldthwaite; Sarah Adams, Charlene 
Ranne of Mullen; from Lubbock 
Kevin and Darcas Shipley, Daniel 
Smith; Mine Hale from Bledsoe; Bill 
and June Breeding from Belton; Letha 
Stroud from Waco; Gary Jones, Yogie 
and Jessica from Amarillo; 

Bill, Corene, Shane, Tracey Schaff-
ner from Big Spring; Kyle Schaffner 
from Tusla, Oklahoma; Vicke, 
Chuck, Sunny, and Vanessa from 
Waco; Curtis and Vickie Lackey from 
Comanche; Thurman, Betty, Tim and 
Amanda from Argyle; Bill, Connie, 
Lance and April from Leander; Mattie 
Peevy from Baird; A.L. and Ora 
Breeding from Cross Plains; 

Attending from Abilene were Wilda 
Jones, Ronnie Green, David, Sharon, 
Josh and Holly Jones, Dub and Nancy 
Jones, Darwin and Joyce Breeding, 
Olivia Jones, Larry Jones and Arlieta 
Thomas, Holly (Haskew) Watson, and 
Pauline Matthiessen. 

However, it rained most of the way 
home riding on the bus. 

Beginning next week, all communi-
ty residents may call in your news as 
usual. I returned from Yuma, Arizona 
Monday where I have been visiting 
with my parents. 

If you think it has been hot here, it 
was 110 to 115 degrees there! 

Lunchroom Policy 

and Meridith, Vernie Belle Mauldin 
and Claribel Gibbs. Rowden was 
home for Jimmy and Bessie Smedley 
on several ocassions during their mar-
riage. Baird was home for them when 
their children were growing up. Both 
were residing in the Baird nursing 
home. Our sympathy is extended to 
her family in their loss. 

On the topic of empty houses, a 
mistake was made of a name last 
week. The write-up was the empty 
house left after the death-of Mrs. Ray 
(Ruth) Boen. The article stated that 
Ruth kept up the house after Ray's 
death. Only the name used was Ralph, 
which was incorrect. Ray and Ruth 
bought the farm with house that had 
been owned by the Walter Jones fami-
ly for many years. In fact, all of the 
Jones children, Lois Haddock, Lorene 
O'Dell, both of Abilene, sons were 
Cecil, Harold and Oscar lived in this 
house. Lois and Lorene are the only 
living members of the Jones family. 
The house during their years on the 
farm was two small houses joined 
together, a back porch was added by 
them. Walter Jones was a good farmer 
and the family was faithful members 
of the Rowden Baptist Church. Their 
farm truck was used for going to 
church revivals at times. The youngest 
boy, Oscar, slept on the truck bed dur-
ing more than one revival. The family 
gardened and the girls helped their 
mother do the canning. This house 
was always open to friends, and as 
they look at it today, many memories 
come to mind. Roland Mauldin pur-
chased the place from Christine 
Bower, sister of Ruth Boen. He farms 
and stocks the land with cattle. 

As part of the student handbook, the 
following lunchroom policy will be in 
effect beginning with the 1988-1989 
school year. 

Any student whose lunchroom ac-
count is in arrears for 45 days or more 
will not be permitted to charge a full 
school lunch. The charged lunch will 
consist of a half pint of milk and a 
sandwich. In addition there will be no 
charges allowed for extra milk. 

The above policy is necessary in 
view of the uncollected accounts car-
ried over from the previous school 
year. It is not the intent of the school to 
allow any child to go hungry, but it is 
necessary that the school continue to 
use good business practices and re-
main accountable to the district for its 
financial management. 

Attention To All 
Peach Growers 

Pork Referendum 
Checkoff Sept. 7-8 

COLONIAL OAKS 
SERVICES 

All peach growers in Callahan 
County who have peach tree borer 
problems can treat trees from now un-
til the end of August, according to 
Greg Gerngross, County Extension 
Agent. Treatment with Dursban, Lin-
dane or Thiodan. 

Producers and homeowners should 
mix according to label directions and 
thoroughly wet from base of trees up 
to first scaffold limbs. 

Peach tree bores can cause trees to 
die if not treated. Contact the County 
Extension office at (915) 854-1518 for 
more information. 

Worship services at Colonial Oaks 
Nursing Home will be conducted by 
the Pioneer Pentecostal Church at 
Pioneer on Sunday, August 28. Ser-
vices will begin at 3:30 p.m. AARP NEWS 

More hot, humid weather continues 
over this area. Light showers Thurs-
day afternoon amounting to three and 
four tenths. Some water puddles were 
seen on the country roads. 

Dorothy Reynolds was in Cross 
Plains where she visited Connie 
Kirkham Friday. On Saturday, the 
Charlie Fortenberry family visited in 
the Reynolds home. 

Leona Gary visited Joyce Odom last 
Saturday afternoon. Leona has had 
company during the week, but this 
writer did not find her home for a 
report on them. 

Julie Dye, daughter of Bob and 
Kathy Dye, and Bryan Patterson, son 
of Clay and Faye Patterson of Baird, 
were united in marriage Saturday 
night in the home of her grandmother, 
Edna Dye. Rev. Howard Hollowell of 
Abilene performed the ceremony 
before members of their families. The 
couple will live in Killeen where he is 
stationed at Fort Hood. We wish hap-
piness for them in the years to come. 
A more detailed report will follow 
next week. 

Irene Masters of Synder met her 
mother, Vernie Belle Mauldin, in 
Abilene Saturday where the two shop- 
Ped• 

Robert, Dorothy and Wyatt Watson 
attended the Pioneer Aviation Day at 
the Elmdale Airport Saturday. During 
the program Wyatt played taps. Brock 
Watson of Duncan, Oklahoma was at 
home for the weekend. 

Emma Johnson and Lizzie Burks at-
tended the reunion of descendants of 
Andrew Jackson and Lee Ann Bui -cs, 
early day residents of this community. 
One other sister, Alice Wills of an 
Abilene rest home attended. Their on-
ly living brother, Robert Burks of the 
Cross Plains nursing home, was not 
able to attend. The family met in 
Potosi this year. Emma reported her 
daughter, Pansy Johnson, had return-
ed to San Antonio after spending a 
year in the small country of Yeman. 
She will carry on her teaching duties at 
Lackland Air Force Base in San An-
tonio. Visitors of Emma and Lizzie 
last week were B.J. Anderson and his 
friend, Joe O'Neal of Rising Star. 
Wayne Burks and his wife brought his 
mother, Nellie Burks, by to see Emma 
and Lizzie during the week. 

Those attending the funeral of 
Bessie Smedley in Baird Saturday 
afternoon were Blan and Jessie Odom 

By LUCILE CALLAWAY 

NOTICE: All members of AARP 
are to meet at 9:30 Monday morning, 
September 5. 

Please bring two covered dishes, 
(large) vegetables, salads, and sweets. 
The Chapter is to furnish the meat. 

We are to have guests from Albany, 
Clyde, Cisco, and Coleman. Mrs. 
Catrett wishes to start the workshop at 
9:30. 

Please, let's make this a good 
meeting. 

I 
I 
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Free And Reduced Price Meals 

Pork producers will have an oppor-
tunity to vote on the Pork Referen-
dum Checkoff on September 7-8, ac-
cording to Greg Gerngross, County 
Extension Agent. 

The purpose of the checkoff rate is 
twenty-five cents per $100 on all pigs 
and hogs sold. 

Any person may vote who produced 
and owned two or more hogs or pigs 
for sale from November 1, 1986 until 
the referendum date. One vote may be 
cast by an individual producer or part-
nership. 

Producers who are unable to vote in 
person on September 7 or 8 may re-
quest an absentee ballot from: Dr. 
W.B. Thomas, Extension Swine 
Specialist, 212 Kleberg Center, Col-
lege Station, Texas 77843. 

Producers must vote in the county of 
residence. The National Pork Pro-
ducers Council has a toll free number 
1-800-255-2255 that producers can 
call for additional information. 

Cross Plains Kiwanis 
TO BE GIVEN AWAY 

SHOTGUN 
(BROWNING 12 GAUGE PUMP MOD.) 

DRAWING TO BE HELD AUG. 23, 1988 

$1 Per Ticket Or 6 For $5.00 
YOU DO NOT HAVE TO BE PRESENT TO WIN 

SCHOOL BOARD 
MEETING SUMMARY 

August 17, 1988 
The Board met to complete prepara-

tions for the 1988-1989 school budget. 
The superintendent mentioned that all 
personnel had been hired for the up-
coming year and that this should be the 
last workshop necessary on the 
budget. 

August 19, 1988, 8 p.m. 
The Board met in a special meeting 

on August 19, 1988, 8 p.m. At this 
time there was an open hearing on the 
proposed 1988-1989 budget. 

After the hearing there was a motion 
to amend the Maintenance and Opera-
tion portion of the 1987-88 budget 
from $1,542,647 to $1,502,847 as the 
actual expenditures for the previous 
year were approximately $30,000 
under the projected expenditures. 

August 19, 1988, 8:15 p.m. 
The board met in another special 

meeting on August 19, 1988, 8:15 
p.m. for the purpose of approving the 
1988-1989 school year budget. The 
budget was approved for the amount 
of $1,705,938. This amount is $3,252 
over the 1987-88 budget. 

The 1988 tax rate was discussed by 
the Board and tabled until the 
September 1988 Board Meeting. 

August 19, 1988, 8:30 p.m. 
The Board met in regular session on 

August 19, 1988, 8:30 p.m. with the 
following business being transacted. 

1. Superintendent Lee Thompson 
and Principals Ray Womack and 
Leonard Wood were approved by the 
board as teacher appraisers and 
evaluators for the 1988-89 school 
year. 

2. The superintendent notified the 
board that the pending law suit against 
one of the current faculty members 
had been dropped. 

3. The Board approved changes in 
the Student Handbook as proposed by 
the Administration. 

4. The financial condition of the 
school was presented to the Board by 
the superintendent and it was agreed 
on that the school was in excellent 
financial condition going into the new 
school year. 

5. After it was approved to pay all 
bills, the motion was made to adjourn. 

application: names of all household 
members; social security numbers of 
all adult household members or a 
statement that the household member 
does not possess one: total household 
income with the amount and source of 
income received by each household 
member, or the household's food 
stamp case number if they currently 
receive food stamps; and the signature 
of an adult household member certify-
ing that the information provided is 
correct. 

Applications may be submitted at 
any time during the year. 

17 41c 

"If you learn just one thing a (fay, 
write it down. And make it a point to 
learn at least one thing every day." 
(Anonymous) 

Cross Plains Public Schools an-
nounces its policy for free and reduced 
price meals for children unable to pay 
the full price of meals served under the 
National School Lunch Program and 
School Breakfast Program. Each 
school campus and the office of the 
Superintendent has a copy of the 
policy, which may be reviewed by any 
interested party. 

The following household size and 
income criteria will be used for deter-
mining eligibility (see income 
eligibility guidelines). Children from 
households whose income is at or 
below the levels shown are eligible for 
free or reduced price meals. 

Application forms will be sent to all 
homes the first thy of school with a 
letter of explanation to the parents or 
guardians. To apply for free or reduc-
ed price meals, households should fill 
out the application and return it to the 
school. Additional copies are available 
at the principal's office during the 
year. The information provided on the 
application will be used for the pur-
pose of determining eligibility and 
may be verified at any time during the 
school year by school or other pro-
gram officials. 

For the school officials to determine 
eligibility, the household must provide 
the following information listed on the 

Cross Plains Independent 
School District Regular 

Lunchroom Prices 
September 1, 1988 

Y2 PRICE 
SALE 

On A Select Group 
Of Office Supplies 

Pens, Tape, Texas Road Maps, 
Rubber Cement, Binder Clips, Chalk, 

And More 

Cross Plains Review 
725-6111 

New Readers: 
Regie Brown, Dyane Dodson, Bob- 

bie Draper, Tammy Bush, Mack 
Watson-Bush. 
Membership: 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Scott, Associate. 
Donations: 

Books - Shana Bagley, Dave and 
Iris Ratliff. 
Circulation: 159 

Paperbacks: 38 
Hardbacks: 113 
Extension: 6 
Interlibrary Loan: 2 
Great buy on novels - $1 each 

(duplicates). 
NOTICE: Library will be closed 

August 29 - September 2 for inven- 
tory. 

Reduced 	  
Adult 	  

BREAKFAST 
Student (K-12) 	  50e 

30c 
75` 

LUNCH 
Student (K-5) 	  85' 
Student (6-12) 	  $1.10 
Reduced 	  40' 
Adult 	  $1.50 

Juice 	  10' 
Milk 	  20C 
Tea 	  20C 

Quit smoking. 
• WnFranliNG ice American Head a 

'OP1 	Association 



13HELP WANTED 

NOW 	 HIRING 
DEMONSTRATORS - House of 
Lloyd/Christmas Around the World 
has combined 3 party plans into one. 
Earn triple pay. Free training, sup-
plies. No investment. Call (817) 
442-4705. 21 Itp 

GRASS MOWING, odd jobs. Motor-
cycle for sale. 725-7642. 21 2rp 

SITTER WANTED for elderly lady 
in Abilene, Texas. Room, board and 
salary. Write to: Sitter, Route 8 Box 
121. Waco, Texas 76705. 21 Hp 

SITUATIONS WANTED 

I NEED WORK - I do lawn mowing 
and small engine repairs. If you need 
my assistance, please call 725-7542. 
19 41c 

ANNOUNCEMENTS 

3LEGAL  NOTICE  

CAUSE NO. 4602 
NOTICE TO ALL PERSONS 
HAVING CLAIMS AGAINST 

THE ESTATE OF 
WILBUR C. MARKS 

Notice is hereby given that Original 
Letters of Guardianship for the Estate 
of Wilbur C. Marks, NCM were 
issued on August 15, 1988, in Cause 
No. 4602, pending in the County 
Court of Callahan County, Texas, to: 

Clara C. Marks 
509 Oak, Box 234 

Clyde, Texas 79510 
All persons having claims against 

this Estate, which is currently being 
administered, are required to present 
them within the time and in the manner 

State Deparbaent of Inghwass 
and Pubic Transportation 

BUSINESS & 
PROFESSIONAL 
DIRECTORY 
Russell Surles 
Abstract Co. 

Prompt & Dependable 
Abstract Service! 

337 Market Street 
Baird, Texas 

Charles Walker, Owner 

Ross L. Jones 
Attorney 

Open Each Wed. 9 am-Noon 

Johnson, Jones 
& Autry 

9th & Main 
(Old Dal-Mar Bldg) 

817 (817) 725-6747 
Coleman: (915) 625-2146 

Brad Harris 
Attorney 

(915) 854.1002 
OR LEAVE MESSAGE 

725-6745 

Cross Plains 
Business 

Service 
751 Main Street 
(817) 725-7712 
Hours: 8:30-4:30 

C-BUILT ENTERPRISE 
Custom cabinet, gun cases, small fur-
niture, quilting frames, whatnots. 
(817) 725-7515, 725-7421. Old 
Skating Rink. 47 tic 

I, CHARLA BROWN, aka known as 
Sharla Iadonisi, will not be responsible 
for any debts, other than my own.  21 4tc 

STILL HAVE A FEW DISHES that 
were left at my home in May. Please 
contact me and I will return them to 
you. Call 725-6812 Linda Malone. 
21 Itp 

DRAIN & SEWER 
REPAIR 

PLUMBING REPAIR 

C & C ENTERPRISE 
BENNY CALLAWAY 

725-6200 
	1 

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS 
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPEMENT 
LILLISATON- KMC 

PLANTERS-DISKS-DRILLS 
ROLLING CULTIVATORS 

CHISELS 
joto/ntrnr 	SELL OR TRADE 

CLARK TRACTOR & SUPPLY, INC 
DELEON (817) 893-2061 
COMANCHE (915) 356-3922 

WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED 

3 Bedroom, l'A Bath, Nice 
Home, siding, fruit trees, ex-
tras, corner of 12th and Ave. A, 
$21,500. 

40'x90' Commercial Building 
on large lot in Rising Star, 
$12,000. 

DORA SMITH, Broker 
(817) 725-6489 

II tic 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES 

CASH 
BUSINESS... 

Buy this high profit candy vending 
route. Nationally proven-- program 
since 1959. Nice family business -
includes training. Requires cash in-
vestment of $4,237 to $14,070. Call 
1-800-328-0723. 

EAGLE INDUSTRIES 
Since1959 21 It 

/ 145 A. on Hwy. 36 in the Hills at Cross 
Plains, lots of Dear. Turkey. Birds. 
$315 A. 

65 A. at Cross Plains, SOLD 

80 A. on Hwy. at Cross Plains, $425 A .  

8 A. on Hwy. at Cottonwood, has 
Mobile Home, Well, Bermuda Grass, 
$22,000. 

W. H. BILL VARNER 
Certified Appraiser 

(915) 672-5658 - 677-8643 

3 Bedroom, 2 Bath on 2 nice 
lots in town, Ave B, a bargain at 

' $14,000. 

Very nice 14'x75' Lancer 
Mobile Home, extras, underpin-
ning, carport, storage, on 2 
acres, fenced, behind Village 
Market, $23,000. 

Trailer house, 4 Commercial 
lots and storage buildings, 
$8,000. 

Beautiful 2 bedroom, 2 bath, 2 
car garage, brick home, land-
scaped, on approx. 14 of an 
acre, $65,000. 

2 bedroom home, I bath, older 
home, $12,000. 

2 bedroom, 1 bath older home 
on Main St., $7,200. 

3 bedroom, I bath, brick home, 
1 1/4  wooded acres, 2 water 
wells, good location. $55,000. 
Reduced to $52,000. 

3.8 A., 2 water wells, barn on 
Hwy. 36, $8,000. 

75 Acres close to town. 

70 Acres, good hunting, $465 
per acre. 

133 Acres, excellent hunting and 
fishing, large stock tank, 2 
creeks, wooded, $478 per acre. 

ROLAN JONES 
(817) 725-7640 

Cross Plains, Tx. 

COPIES 
MADE 

AT THE 

CROSS PLAINS 
REVIEW 

• CVJANTITY DISCOUNTS 
• ENLARGEMENTS 
• REDUCTIONS 
• LEGAL & LETTER A 

/S 

Clovis Simons 
(817) 725-7484 	Box 604 

L  CROSS PLAINS TEXAS j 

rCLOVIS SEPTIC 
TANK & 
BACKHOE 

SPECIAUZING IN SEWER SYSTEM 
INSTALLATION & SERVICE 

DONALD R. DUKE 
PLUMBING 

<,\c4  
,t\el.,  is) 

& ELECTRIC 
Please Call 

Day or Night 

(817) 725-6741 

Donald and Doris Uuke 
ownerloperators 

required by law. 
DATED: August 15, 1988 

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED, 
BRAD HARRIS 

P.O. Box 1177 
Baird, Texas 79504 

State Bar No. 09061800 
(915) 854-1002 

Attorney for the Estate of 
Wilbur C. Marks, NCM 

CAUSE NO. 4604 
NOTICE TO ALL PERSONS 
HAVING CLAIMS AGAINST 

THE ESTATE OF 
E.G. HUCKABEE 

Notice is hereby given that Original 
Letters of Administration for the 
Estate of E.G. HUCKABEE were 
issued on August 15, 1988, in Cause 
No. 4604, pending in the County 
Court of Callahan County, Texas, to: 

Cecil Eudean Huckabee 
6005 Whispering Lane 

Ft. Worth, Texas 76148 
All persons having claims against 

this Estate, which is currently being 
administered, are required to present 
them within the time and in the manner 
required by law. 

DATED: August 16, 1988 

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED, 
BRAD HARRIS 

P.O. Box 1177 
Baird, Texas 79504 

State Bar No. 09061800 
(915) 854-1002 

Attorney for the Estate of 
F, G. Huckabee, Deceased 

FOR SALE 

MONUMENTS AND MEMORI-
ALS Cliff Kirkham is agent for Riley-
Gardener Monument Service of 
Hamilton, Texas for the Cross Plains 
area. Contact Cliff Kirkham for com-
plete information on quality 
monuments. Call (817) 725-6500.14  tk. 

FOR YOUR MARY KAY PRO-
DUCTS Call Pauniece' Oglesby, 
725-6772. Have all Mary Kay 
Cosmetics line in stock - ladies and 
men's skin care, body and fragrance 
items. Free Delivery, Gift wrapping. 
14 tic 

CARPET CLEANING 
Commercial/Residential. 	Free 
estimates. Scotchguarding available. 
Carpet sold, repaired, installed. New 
or used. Dub Meador (817) 725-7720. 
10 tic 

MANTEE 2 BEDROOM mobile 
home 70' X 14' for sale. D.R. McIn-
nis Ranch 725-7219. 19 tk 

FOR SALE - Hybrid Sudan hay. 
Round bales, extra large, fertilized. 
N.L. Long (915) 784-5153. 20 2tp 

FISHING BOAT 15'/2 ft. Tidecraft 
w/tilt trailer. 50hp Chrysler and troll-
ing motor. Great shape. 725-6845 at 
night or 725-7355 in day. 20 etc 

HAY FOR SALE - Over 100 large 
round bales of bright heavily fertilized 
coastal. 725-6845 at night or 725-7355 
in day. 202E 

KLEIN GRASS ROUND BALES for 
sale $25 a bale. Dub Meador, P.O. 
Box 56, Cross Plains. (817) 725-7720. 

20 2tc 

FOR SALE - Satellite Systems or 
repair any system. Call (817) 
725-6548. 204tc 

ALL OVER COUNTER SALES are 
at wholesale dealers prices. Pettiet 
Auto Parts. 20 4tp 

FOR SALE - Refrigerator. 505 E. 
9th St. or call 725-6484. 21 up 

FOR SALE - One cast iron heater. 
Call (817) 725-6463. 21 itp 

BEEF: Halves $1.39 lb. Hind Quarter 
$1.59 lb. Fore Quarter $1.25 lb. 
Locker Plant 725-7571. 21 Itc 

BOYS TENNIS SHOES size 81/2 -3 
and 31/2 -6, nylon with leather trim, 
assorted styles, $9.99 to $16.99. 
Johnson's Dry Goods. 21 It< 

REGISTERED 
PUBLIC 

SURVEYOR 
JOHN D. BURLESON 
BOX 365 CROSS PLAINS 

817-725-6485 
OIL WELL LOCATIONS, 

LOTS, PIPELINES 

• 

• 
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KNOW YOUR 
LIMITS... 

SPEED 
LIMIT 

65 
Maximum legal speed for cars, 
motorcycles, commercial buses 
and light trucks in rural zones of 
Interstate designated 
highways.  

SPEED 
LIMIT 

55 
	 • 

Still the maximum legal speed 
permitted in most highway zones. 

...it's to your safety 
advantage. 

A courteous reminder from 
the DPS Troopers .  

15REAL ESTATE 

26.30 ACRES with Oak trees, relax-
ing view of countryside, north of 
Cross Plains, $1,270 down, approx-
imately $145 monthly - best financ-
ing available for veterans. Ken Eason 
Real Estate (915) 784-5653 or 
784-5155. 212,, 
FOR SALE OR RENT - 581 E. 9th. 
2 bedroom, kitchen, and bathroom, 
remodeled, large lot $10,000. Call 
725-7332 or 725-6318. 21 tk 
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CLASSIFIED RATES 
$3.00 for the first 20 
words. 	Additional 
words 200 each. 

is 	  
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mi Ns le IN um NI No mi um a 

SFOR SALE  

GIRLS WRANGLER BAGGIE 
JEANS size 8-14 dark or stonewashed 
$14.99. Johnson's Dry Goods.  21 Itc 

FOR SALE - A Hotpoint electric 
stove, good condition $100. For infor- 
mation call 725-6113. 21 he 

AUTOS FOR SALE 

FOR SALE -  1978 Grand Prix 
2-door, good condition $1,250. 
725-6409. 21 it, 

gasimmommimmik 
GARAGE SALES 

CAR PORT SALE - Friday, August 
26, at W.G. McCoy's home, 11th and 
Avenue E. Four family treasures!!! 
21 Rp 

GARAGE SALE - Saturday ONLY, 
Aug. 27, 8 a.m. at Hillcrest Motel, 
Room #1, Karen Richey and Cindy 
Payne. Nurses uniforms size 4-5, lots 
of kids' clothes. 21 ltt 

YARD SALE - Thursday and Fri-
day, 9 a.m. - 5:30 p.m. FOUR Fami-
ly Sale. Variation of teen, children, 
adult clothes and miscellaneous. At 
Deana Strickland's home, 21 ltc 

GARAGE SALE - Wednesday 9-6, 
Thursday 9-6. Lots of kids clothes and 
some ladies clothes, size 10. White 
house behind Shamrock Station.  21 Itp  

BIG GARAGE SALE - Furniture, 
ceiling fans, men and women's 
clothes, miscellaneous items. Home of 
Junior Baugh on Avenue H. Wednes-
day - Saturday. 21 Itc 

HUGE YARD SALE, 731 West 8th, 
Baird. Iron wash pot, treadmill, over 
2,000 more things. 7 a.m. - 8 p.m. 
Thursday, Friday, and Saturday. 21 up 

assi 
"LOST & FOUND 

LOST - Red Brangus Yearling Bull 
Branded C 71 7 on Left Hip. Dan 
Childress 725-6279. 21 tic  

REWARD for return of ladies blue 
billfold lost at Village Market or 
Lakeway. The cards and driver's 
license has the last name of Kyle. The 
first name is Janice, Joe and Thelma. 
Please call Janice Kyle Buckner 
725-7638. 21 lk 

STRAYED BEEFMASTER BULL, 
3 miles southwest of town on Hwy ,  
206. Call Tommie Harris 725-7254 or 
Jimmie Harris 725-6693. 21 lip 

"HELP WANTED  

GET PAID for reading books! 
$100.00 per title. Write: PASE-
C3734, 161 S. Lincolnway, N. 
Aurora, IL 60542. 18 4tp  

FRIENDLY HOME PARTIES has 
openings in this area for managers and 
dealers. Earn free Hawaiian trip. Free 
training. Commission up to 25%. 
Highest hostess awards, no delivering 
or collecting, no handling or service 
charge. Over 800 dynamic items -
Toys, Gifts, Home Decor and 
Christmas Decor. For free catalog call 
1-800-227-1510. 20 34, 

a 
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17FOR RENT 

FOR RENT OR LEASE house and 
50 acres 6 miles from town. Call (915) 
523-2531. 204,p 
FOR RENT - Two bedroom house 
with washer and dryer hook-ups. Call 
725-7121. 21 Itc 

RENT OR SALE, owner finance, 4 
bedroom house on 4 commercial lots, 
good location, $6,000. 725-6205. 21 14. 

'BUSINESS SERVICES 

HOMECOMING BABYS1TTING 
- Call now and reserve a place for 
your child. Sandy Yates 725-6131 or 
725-6742. 20 2t.  

Meet Your Future 
With A Straight Face 

Buckle Up 
Texas Coalition for Safety Belts 

15WANTED 

WOULD LIKE TO LEASE LAND 
for cattle grazing within 40 mile radius 
of Cross Plains. Doug Tull, Monday 
- Friday 8 a.m. - 5 p.m. (915) 
699-4916; Weekends (915) 685-1319 
or (817) 725-6737. ,s tk 

LET US SELL YOUR OLD CAR or 
pickup for you - no cost to you! Any 
condition, need complete restorable 
vehicles. I can pick up! Lewis Enter-
prises on Interstate 20 at Clyde (817) 
893-4584 or 1 (800) 234-2252. 21 2tc 

TWICE AROUND SHOP - 705 
Conrad Hilton, Cisco, Texas, (817) 
442-4180 - Great "Back to School" 
Buys, clothing & shoes for all the 
family! NOW taking consignments on 
children's clothes, also buying and 
consigning old costume jewery 
(rhinestones, etc.). 21 etc 

PAYING CASH - For men's wat-
ches made before 1950. Call 1 (800) 
666-3966, Monday - Frider ask for 
Chuck. (512) 49t-4961 collect. Will 
be in town September 9 and 10. 213i, 

WE WOULD APPRECIATE YOUR 
JOHN DEERE, ULLISTRON & KMC 

PARTS BUSINESS 
LOWEST PRICES IN AREA ON 
ADAMS PLOW SHARES AND 

BALDAN DISK BLADES. 
IN STOCK SIZES TO FIT 

MOST BRANDS. 

lia CLARK TRACTOR 

& SUPPLY INC. 
COMMANCHE (915) 356-3922 

DELEON (817) 893-2062 

Susan J. Schaefer, 
C.P.A.  

Accounting & Tax 
Service 
9th & Main 
Cross Plains 

Phone: 725-6747 

CROSS PLAINS REVIEW 
(UPS 138.880) 

DON TABOR, PUBLISHER 
CROSS PLAINS REVIEW 

(UPS 138-660) is published 
weekly on Wednesday for 
$10.00 per year within 30 
miles of Cross Plains and/or 
Callahan County; $12.00 per 
year elsewhere in Texas; 
$14.00 per year out of state 
(No foreign copies except APO 
or like address); by Review 
Publishing Co. 155 E. 8th St., 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443. 
Second-class postage paid at 
Cross Plains, Texas. 
POSTMASTER: Send address 
changes to Cross Plains 
Review, P.O. Box 519, Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443. 
Telephone (817) 725-6111. 

Nina Jo  • 
Registered Representative 
Personal Financial Planner roniamonommmnimmumormio. 

EXPERT BODY WORK AND PAINTING 

BARRETT BODY SHOP 
I 

I 

Bus. (817) 725-6747 

We Specialize In
CLAUDE CHAMPION, OWNER 

915- 677-2924 ABILENE, TX.79603 FOREIGN CARS & 
'LUXURY  CARS 	 24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 
1  214 N. LEGGETT 	 915-672-4064 
Lonniumnimmnamannnil 

IDS Financial Services Inc. 
IDS Life Insurance Company 

An American Express Co. 



F SH 
Now is the time for Pond and 
Lake Stocking Hybrid 
Bluegill, Florida Hybrid Bass, Channel Catfish, 
and Fathead Minnows. 
The Hybrid Bluegill will REACH the weight of 21/2  
to 3 lbs. We furnish your Hauling Containers. We 
guarantee live delivery. Delivery will be WEDNES-
DAY, AUGUST 31, at the times listed for the 
following towns and locations. 
Breckenridge — Town and Country Feed and Supply 8:00-9:00 a.m. 559-3737 
Albany — Albany Feed and Seed 10:00-11:00 a.m. 762-2634 
Eastland — Eastland Farm and Ranch 12:00-1:00 p.m. 629-2173 
Cross Plains — Cross Plains Grain and Peanut Co. 2:00-3:00 p.m. 725-7345 
Rising Star — Farmers Supply 4:00-5:00 p.m. Call us at (405) 777-2202 

Call your local Feed Store to place your order or call 14051 777-2202 
Fishery consultant and pond rotsnaning availisbla 
Spatial Olivrisi on lap ponds and lag orders. 

DUNN'S FISH FARM 
P.O. BOX 85 	 FITTSTOWN, OK 74842 

•-•  
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CORNER 

By LOVERA STRICKLAND 
CJC Making 
Preparations To Begin 
Fall 1988 Semester 

I'll Join 
Audience 
Next Time 

Mildred Klarfield of Houston and 
her daughter, Mary Kay of Dallas, 
visited her brother, Wayne Newton, 
and her aunt, Kathryn Craven;, last 
weekend. They also visited Addie 
Newton and Jo Davee. 

Adrian Price of Coleman, Marsha 
and Jon Turney of Santa Anna, and 
Lat Mountain visited Jack and Lovera 
Strickland Sunday. 

Jody and Eureta Whitley of San 
Saba and Jack and Lovera Strickland 
visited Lat Mountain Saturday after-
noon. 

Jerry Biehl of Early and Ruby Biehl 

Eric Robertson 
Graduates From 
TSTI, Sweetwater 

Texas State Technical Institute-
Sweetwater Campus is proud to an-
nounce that the Commencement Exer-
cises for the graduating Class of 1988. 
took place on August 12 at the Sweet-
water High School Auditorium. 

According to Dr. Clay Johnson. 
Campus President. these graduates 
have completed their programs since 
November of 1987. February of 1988. 
May 1988 and August of 1988. 

Eric Robertson received an 
Associate in Electronics Servicing 
Technology. He is a former graduate 
of Cross Plains. Mrs. Rena Robertson 
and the late Oliver Robertson Sr. are 
his parents. 

of Coleman visited Dalton and Lucille 
Gould Friday afternoon. 

The 42 Club met at Ruby Biehl's 
last Thursday. Those attending were 
Vera Pearl Bunnell and Ernestine 
Watson of Cross Plains. Ottie Mayo of 
Coleman and Ruby Hampton, a guest 
from Coleman, Jo Davee, Zora 
DeBusk and Lucille Gould of Burkett, 
and the hostess Ruby Biehl. Everyone 
had a great time and the refreshments 
were very tasty. 

Russell Gould, Eli and Alisa of 
Abilene spent the weekend with 
Dalton and Lucille Gould. 

Harlow Family 
Reunion Held 
August 12.14 Happy 

Birthday 

At Ease, Men 

I certainly appreciated and enjoyed 
"Flowers For Sitter." Thank you. 
Connie, for this long overdue tribute. I 
have been one who has received love 
from her all my life and am thankful to 
be called her friend. 

I am also very proud of the things 
that have been done to beautify "OUR 
TOWN." The barrels of flowers say 
"WELCOME." 

If you haven't noticed, look around. 
Vacant lots have been mowed, pain-
ting is being done and everything is 
shaping up. Please notice Bishop's car 
lot! We are also very proud of the 
painting that has been completed at 
Hub's blacksmith shop. Jamie, you 
did a fantastic job! 

Have you noticed the marquis? 
Thanks to the Kiwanis and ex-
students. There is still more work to 
be done, but everyone is still working 
and we have a town to be proud of. 

Thanks to all the local merchants 
who support every project that is 
started. We all appreciate you so 
much. 

Let's keep working. 
Margaret McNeel 

■■■ 
AUGUST 25 
Mrs. Morris Odom 
Benny Free 
Dorothy Johnson 
Mrs. Tom Cox 
Mrs. James W. Lindsey 
Belinda Hefner 
Rick Hines 
Danyelle' Johnson 

"A Soldier In The War On Drugs 
To All Good Americans" 

AUGUST 26 
James R. (Dick) Wagner 
Mrs. James Hall 
Charles Lee 
Dee Perry 
Billy Wagner 
Mrs. Edwin Weiss 
Rocky Callaway 
Kevin Shane Singleton 
Bertis Letney 

The family of the late Jim and Ida 
Harlow had a family reunion at the 
home of Jean Fore in Pioneer August 
12. 13, and 14, 1988. 

Present were Bessie McDaniel of 
San Antonio; Vi Harlow of Marble 
Falls: Paul and Juanita Harlow, Hun-
tington, New Mexico; and Ryan 
Harlow of Lovington, New Mexico: 
Grasson and Myrtle Harlow, Clyde; 
Debbie Harlow, Arlene, Hanna and 
Arthur, Arlington; Amy Wright, Toni 
and Natalie of Bullard; Doris and 
Milford Hunter of Alamagordo, New 
Mexico; and Buddy and Linda 
McDaniel of San Antonio. 

Everyone had a wonderful weekend 
and those that didn't attend missed a 
good time. 

AUGUST 27 
Elizabeth Jane Cavanaugh 
R.L. Carey 
Michael Cowan 
Mrs. Doyle Lovell 
Minnie Wrinkle 
Monty Champion 

28th Annual 
Coin Show 
Set Sept. 10-11 

AUGUST 28 
Rex Tackett 
Aaron Jason Pope 
Billy Dolgener 
Wade Odom 
Dawn Strength 
Mrs. Eula Foster 
Mrs. Freddy Tatom 
Kim Gregory 
Marcia Hoover 
Marie Schaefer 

Cisco Junior College is making 
preparations to begin its Fall semester. 
Since 1940. CJC has offered quality 
academic and vocational programs in a 
small college setting at a very low 
cost. The smaller classes and in-
terested. well-qualified faculty pro-
vide more opportunity for individual 
instruction. CJC's Counseling Office 
provides information about career 
choices. qualifications and job oppor-
tunities for students unsure of their 
career plans. 

Various financial aid programs are 
available to students on the basis on 
need and/or merit in the forms of 
grants. loans, work study and depart-
mental activity scholarships. Financial 
Aid is available if qualified at all three 
locations — Cisco. Clyde and Abilene. 

In Clyde CJC offers day and night 
academic classes. These courses are 
designed to help fulfill the first two 
years of study leading to a bac-
calaureate degree. 

Cisco Junior College offers 
numerous vocational programs at the 
Abilene Center at Office Park West 
(209 S. Danville). Programs offered 
are Auto Mechanics, Child Care and 
Development, Electronics, Fire 
Technology, Human Services, Law 
Enforcement. Licensed Vocational 
Nursing, Maintenance Engineering, 
Mid-Management, Real Estate, 
Refrigeration and Air Conditioning, 
and Medical Assisting Technology. 
Fire Technology and Law Enforce-
ment are taught at Dyess. 

Registration for the Abilene Center 
is August 25 from 9 a.m. to 4 p.m. and 
6 to 8 p.m. Students wishing to 
register at the Clyde Center is August 
24 from 9 a.m. to 12 noon and 1 to 4 
p.m. and 6 to 8 p.m. Registration for 
the Cisco Campus is September I from 
8:30 to 12 noon and 1 to 4 p.m. Night 
registration will also be held on Thurs-
day, September 1 from 6 to 8 p.m. 

For more information call the ap-
propriate campus at one of the follow-
ing numbers: Cisco (817) 442-2567; 
Clyde (915) 893-5976; Abilene (915) 
698-2212. 

The 28th Annual Coin Show, spon-
sored by the San Angelo Coin Club, 
will be held at the Holiday Inn 
Ballroom, 441 Rio Concho Drive in 
San Angelo on Saturday and Sunday, 
September 10 and 11. 

Admission is free to the public. 
Everyone is invited to attend. 

AUGUST 29 
Everett Wright 
Susan (Coppinger) Cohn 

AUGUST 30 
Steven Lane Cox 
Eldon Renfro 
Marty Callaway 
Chuck Woody 
Mrs. Jack (Lisa) Hinkle 
Socrates Walker 
James Scott 
Ritta Knight 
D.T. Crockett, Jr. 
Laura Holley 
Randall McAnally 
Donald Wilson 
James Neil Ross 
Carl Bludworth 
Allen Barnett 

AUGUST 31 
Mrs. Emil Ringhoffer, Jr. 
Danny Johnson 
C.M. Garrett 
Mrs. Travis Foster 
Jean (Bonner) McWilliams 
Kathryn Harris 
Vickie (Stover) Odom 
R.S. Peevy 
Terri Jean (Vaught) Krueger 
Marie Harrell 
Karen Richey 
Mrs. L.D. DeBusk 
Rich Holder 
George Cavanaugh 
David Gray 
Chester Phillips 

        

        

        

        

  

OLD CARS 
& PICKUPS 

WANTED!  

    

        

  

1920's,930's,1940's 1950's, 1960's  
ANY CONDITION-IT MAY ONLY LOOK LIKE JUNK. 

LET US SELL YOUR OLD CAR OR PICKUP FOR YOU, 
AT NO COST TO YOU! WE CAN COME AFTER ITt 

LEWIS ENTERPRISES 
1-20 AT CLYDE OR CALL 1-893-4584, 

OR TOLL FREE 1-800-234-2252 
TRAVEL TRAILERS & MOTOR HOMES SOLD ON CONSIGNMENT! 

   

         

         

  

Cross Plains 
Medical Clinic 

Office Hours 
Monday — Friday 

9:00 a.m. — 5:00 p.m. 
Saturday 

9 a.m. — 12 Noon 
1042 Main Street 	 Cross Plains 

725-6728 — Available 24 Hours 
Medicare•Medicaid Patients Welcome 	Or. Ek now tull time physician 

   

By DON TABOR Publisher 

Maybe the title of this should be "How 
I Spent My Summer Vacation". 

Or "How I Nearly Didn't Get to Have 
Any More Summer Vacations". 

A couple of weekends ago, my son, 
Bryan, who lives in New Braunfels, 
arranged for his mother and I and Don 
and Yvonne Barr to take a five-hour trip 
on a rubber raft down the Guadalupe 
River. 

The river, ice cold after it's let out of the 
bottom of Canyon Lake, is at optimum 
level right now for such activity, 

meaning it's running pretty fast. 
Bryan accompanied us in a little 

rubber canoe as did a friend of his who 
had been a guide for these river trips. 

But, here's the key for what was about 
to happen, neither was in the raft with us. 

His friend gave us the standard advice 
like "always keep the raft pointed 
forward" and "fall in the raft, not out of 
it". As I found out later, the last bit of 
advice was easier said than done. 
. There are about three sets of big rapids 
and/or falls on the 10-mile trip which 
ends at Gruene (pronounced "green") 
just north of New Braunfels. 

We made the first of these (named 
"Waco" for some reason unknown to 
me) okay with me perched on the back 
of the raft using my oar like a rudder to 
help keep the raft straight. 

Then we approached the next set, 
named "Slumber". There were danger 
signs and signs advising only 
experienced river riders to try it strung 
across the river. But, heck, we'd made 
one so weren't we experienced now? 

Then we hit it. "Slumber" is a rock 
dam built across the river and as the river 
rolls over it, a five-foot waterfall is 
created. 

We nose-dived over the dam with me 
sitting on the edge of the raft at the back 
still playing rudder. When we hit the 
bottom of the falls, we did what we 
weren't supposed to do, we turned 
sideways. The back-tow of the falls then 
brought us back into it. 

Just then another raft came over the 
falls and smacked us broadside. At that 
point, I can only testify to what 
happened to me on out. I had my last 
glimpse of our raft with my heels in the 
air as the other raft knocked me off the 
rim into the water. 

I was wearing a life jacket but I hadn't 
bothered to tie it at the top so the first 
thing it did when I hit the water was float 
over my head and so it was worthless to 
me. 

The under-tow from the falls sucked 
me to the bottom about seven feet down 
and then pushed me to the top again. But 
I soon discovered this was going to 
become a habit - - down and then up 
again with the tow. I wasn't going down 
river at all, just rolling up and down 
underneath the falls. 

Considering the shape my fat little 
body was in, I figured I could keep doing 
this for, maybe, three minutes, then I 
didn't know. 

Oh, yeah, I didn't mention that I had an 
audience for all this. There were 40 or 
50 people gathered on the bank. They 
apparently get a good Sunday 
afternoon's entertainment watching 

• folks scramble for their lives in the falls. 
Of course, everone of those on dry land 

was an expert on how I should extricate 
myself from my wet predicament. Each 
time I'd bob up, they'd yell a wide 
variety of advice to me, none of which I 
was in any condition to take. Most o f the 
advice was pretty well soaked with an 
ample supply of beer anyway. None of 
them volunteered to do what I was 
hoping for most, throw me a line. 

After a couple of minutes, a couple of 
kids on a big inner tube came over the 
falls and got hung up in the back-tow 
too. I grabbed a suing attached to the 
tube and one of the kids hollered for me 
to climb on. I didn't have the strength to 
holler back that if I had the strength to 
climb on, I'd be more than happy to do 

• so. 
I was getting more tired by the second 

as I clung to that string, and, I'll admit, I 
was beginning to think about letting 
panic set in. 

Then, as my mother is fond of saying, 
my "Guardian Angel" came to the 
rescue. I looked up and a big raft was 
coming out-of-control over the falls. It 
smashed into the kids' innertube and me 
and knocked us all out of the fall's back- 

Our country has been invaded — the 
enemy is at your doorstep. The Presi-
dent has declared war. We are losing 
this war and we must not! I call on all 
Americans to become a soldier in the 
war on drugs. Enlist today! Become 
the eyes, ears and working partners 
with the Drug Task Force. 

My "Time to Stand" came when I 
realized what Col. Travis and these 
189 brave souls meant when they 
crossed that line and paid "The Price 
of Freedom" at the Alamo. That line 
of freedom was drawn for you and me 
to cross. I have crossed over. I was a 
pot smoker; aiding the enemy. There 
are many more Americans aiding the 
enemy, too, by looking the other way 
when friends do drugs. 

I was one of the worst, giving aid to 
the enemy for I put on a front of caring 
for my country. Since the President 
has declared war, I have committed 
treason. I hope my fellow countrymen 
can forgive me. I have come back to 
my country. I am now a "Soldier in 
the War on Drugs." 

I freely came forward to the Drug 
Task Force to take on what is the 
worst enemy of all. The dealer in my 
community is also called Leader of the 
Community. The bust went sour. It is 
said I broke his trust, I say his trust is 
that I will keep quiet while he and 
others like him destroy America. Are 
there ones like him in your communi-
ty? 

The "Price of Freedom" has come 
higher than life itself to me. I lost 
something that is life to me, my wife 
and 3 boys. Not shot or killed, but my 
wife disagreed with me for'coming 
forward. I can see some of her points 
about hurting the family, but in every 
war of freedom families do get hurt. 
Mine is one of them. I did what I did 
for my boys and all America's 
children, so they could have freedom 
and a bright future. 

We are losing this war, because peo-
ple make the soldiers (both drug users 
and non-drug users) who are fighting 
feel what they are doing is wrong by 
calling them names like stool pigeon, 
informer, etc. Now I think I know 
what these young soldiers felt like that 
were going to Vietnam when they 
were called "Baby Killers," etc. by 
their fellow countrymen. We should 
honor the soldiers in the war on drugs, 
because many more would enlist from 
both parties. I know those students 
who do drugs don't want to be called 
these names by others. Do not be 
ashamed to be called a name in this 
war for you are our country's future in 
winning this war. 

I feel no shame to be called a stool 
pigeon. It's an honor of freedom. 

I am going through Texas, trying to 
recruit an army of Texas volunteers to 
make a stand and some day be able to 
defeat the enemy. I know if I had 
stayed in Comanche, Texas, I could 
not defeat the drug people because 
some of them are powerful and I am a 
nobody. 

I am missing my 5-year-old's birth-
day while I'm out here. I hope he will 
understand and pray that my birthday 
gift to him will be that Texas has 
begun to form an army to win this war 
and freedom. 

If we are not able to form an army 
here in Texas where "The Price of 
Freedom" has meant so much, then 
we could lose this war. Texan, your 
"Time to Stand" has come! Your 
country needs you to show them the 
way by holding and winning here in 
Texas. 

We can't afford to lose another war. 
Stand and cross over the line of 
freedom. 

The following article was published 
in the Quad-City Times on July 22, 
1988. It was written by Bill Wundrum. 

He was so gentle, and he talked so 
softly. We shared a beer last night, 
visiting above the babble of memory 
of 600 or 700 of his feisty pals — the 
toughest GI's of World War H. They 
say so! 

Gen. George S. Patton's 4th Ar-
mored Division is in the Quad-Cities 
— its 42nd reunion. 

I'm visiting with Doug Herndon, a 
wiry ex-sergeant from Hamilton, 
Ohio. No particular reason; he's just 
the first to offer a beer at Moline Holi-
day Inn. 

■ He pulls a yellowed clipping from 
his wallet. It's an AP story, one of 
those classic tales of the bold, brave 
men of Patton's 4th Armored. 

It tells how a sergeant — though he 
knew there were only nine other 
Americans within 10 miles — stepped 
in front of a German column, convinc-
ed a Nazi major that his troops were 
surrounded, and forced the surrender 
of 61 men and 23 vehicles. 

■ "That sergeant was me," he says, 
blowing off the foam. He introduces 
me to a distinguished-looking fellow, 
his wife and grandson. They speak on-
ly French. The smiling gent is Andre 
Dechambre, mayor of Douchy. 

"Andre was with the Free French; I 
turned my prisoners over to him. 
We've been friends ever since. They 
came to America to spend their vaca-
tion in the Quad-Cities with their old 
pals from the 4th Armored Division. 
Our outfit liberated this city." 

■ Doug, Andre, and all the others 
are what make this reunion so 
remarkable. Has there ever been a 
gathering like it in the Q-Cities? 
Without guys like this, would all of us 
be here today? 

I look over the mellowing crowd, 
graying in its September years. No 
longer the warriors; it looks like a con-
vention of mid-age Rotarians. But 
these are "Patton's Pets," who gutted 
their way through the Battle of the 
Bulge and ground through the buzz-
saw hell of Europe to the Rhine. 

"We killed 37,000 Germans and 
captured 82,000. That's more than any 
other division in the war," says Don 
Hillyard of Bremen, Ohio. He has five 
battle stars on his ETO ribbon. He 
makes a snappy salute, holding up the 
lightning-zagged patch of the 4th Divi-
sion. "Wotta outfit," he says. 

■ In the 40's, they were mostly 
kids, tough, with dirt in their ears and 
freezing, wet socks on their feet. Their 
lives were stripped of convention and 
niceties. Their nobility and dignity 
came from the way they lived and risk-
ed their lives to help each other, and to 
save America's neck. 

Sure, they griped and gold-bricked 
and bitched. But when they faced cold 
steel and screaming lead, they beat the 
hell out of the opposition. 

They were together under the worst 
conditions of war, and the talk always 
drifts to their old commander, Gen. 
Patton, old "blood and guts." His 
guts, and their blood.. They toast him 
in admiration. 

"I was taking a badly wounded guy 
to a field hospital. We stretched him 
on the front of a Jeep. Patton came 
along, ordered us to follow. He led the 
way in his staff car," says Doug Hern-
don. 

■ Joe McBride of Somer's Point, 
N.J. joins in the talk. He says: "That 
war was the last time America had its 
head screwed on." 

One listens. You vividly see the 
sights, sounds, smells and feelings of 
those war years...a vivid resurrection 
of a lost time. 

Hubert M. Belew of Cross Plains 
was in the 22nd A.F.A. of this great 
4th Armored Division. Hubert was 
with the third wave that landed in Nor-
mandy, France and received a Bronze 
Star in July 1944. Belew was a cor-
poral at that time and made sergeant 
and was tank sergeant in Battle of the 
Bulge. He received two Bronze Stars 
and five major Battle Stars. 

He and his wife, Celia, attended the 
4th Armored Division reunion at 
Moline, Illinois in July and enjoyed all 
three days and seeing a lot of old bud-
dies. 

Drug Task Force 
(915) 675-6964 

tow, much, I'm sure, to the 
disappointment of our audience. 

Despite my portly appearance, I am a 
fair swimmer and it was an easy matter, 
then, to get to the river bank. 

Bryan, his friend and the others in my 
raft had all made it over "slumber" okay 
and had pulled up on the bank. The 
water was too swift for them to have 
come to my aid, so all they could do was 
wait for me. 

If you ever go on one of these trips, I've 
got a few pieces of advice for you. No. 
1 is have a guide on your raft who knows 
what he's doing. No. 2 is sit IN the raft, 
not on the edge of it. No. 3 is tie your life 
jacket where ever they have a place to tie 
it. 

But, for me, I think next time I'll just 
join the audience. 

A Soldier in the War on Drugs 
Gary Cobb 

"Remember Drug-Free America!" 



GERMAN OR MESQUITE 
SAUSAGE 

9c GOOCH BLUE 
RIBBON 

12 OZ. PKG. 

HAM CHUB MR. TURKEY 

MR. TURKEY 
LUNCHEON MEAT VARIETY PAK 

,.$1.79 
12 OZ. PKG. $ 2.29 

12 OZ. PKG. 89c 

3 LB. BOX $ 3.29  

)
3 LBS. FOR $ i  

1.89c 
L. 69c 

FRESH 

CANTALOUPES $  1, 
BANANAS DOLE GOLDEN RIPE 

	
3 LBS FOR $1 	GRAPES FLAME RED SEEDLESS 

NECTARINES LARGE FANCY 
	 LB .69c GREEN CABBAGE 

TOILET TISSUE 
	 SOFIA-PRETTY 

' 'PiV 	4 ROLL 

99c 
Pet Foods 

CAT FOOD FANCY FEAST 3 OZ. 

FIELD TRIAL 40 LB. 
CHUNK DOG FOOD 
CHEF'S BLEND 4 LB. 
CAT FOOD 
KOZY KITTEN 14.7 OZ. 
CAT FOOD 

DETERGENT 
TIDE LIQUID 

64 OZ. 

Ir1 I I klel 111:11.1 :1 
QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED 

Cross Plain, Rev ie,, 
Wednesday. August 2-i. 198, 	8 

EVERY MONDAY IS N  
SENIOR CITIZENS DAY 

5% DISCOUNT ON 
YOUR TOTAL 
PURCHASES. 40 

STORE HOURS 
MONDAY—SATURDAY 	7 A.M.-8 P.M. 
SUNDAY 	 8 A.M.-7 P.M. 
QUANITITY RIGHTS RESERVED 

WEEK LONG SPECIALS 
SAVE THIS AD, SHOP ANY DAY YOU LIKE —

SPECIAL PRICES IN THIS AD EFFECTIVE 
August 24 thru August 30, 1988 

We Have Postage Stamps & Money Orders 

We Accept 
FOOD STAMPS 
& WIC CARDS 

1-hone 725-7131 Cross Plains, Texas 

DOUBLE COUPONS 7 DAYS A WEEK 
AFFILIATED'S 43rd ANNIVERSARY SALE  

GRAND PRIZE- 1988 OLDSMOBILE CUTLASS SUPREME, 	REGISTER AS MANY TIMES AS YOU LIKE! 

PLUS: MANY OTHER VALUABLE PRIZES, PLUS: TRIPS- Grand Prize winners will be announced on September 

TO HAWAII, JAMAICA & LAS VEGAS ! 	 12, 1988 & Winners will be notified by Affiliated Foods 
Must be 18 years of age 8 complete an authorized entry blank In the store In your own handwriting No purchase is required you need not be present to win Contest ends August 27th, 1888 

$5000  GIFT CERTIFICATE FOR GROCERIES GIVEN AT VILLAGE MARKET, AUGUST 27, 1988!! 

Register At 
Villa. e Market 

Many PRIZES To 
Be Given Away! 

TOP SIRLOIN 
STEAK 249 

SPLIT FRYERS 
EXCELLENT FOR BBQ 

LB. 

IL USDA CHOICE 

LOUIS RICH 

SHURFRESH 	
3.29 FRANKS BREAST OF TURKEY OHM ROASTED 11.0.$10101. NO LB $ 	

SHURFRESH 

	

n 	HANDY'S WESTERN 
LUNCH MEAT 	 1 LB. PKG. $ 1•1 a 	BEEFHPATTIES 

POTATOES 
.99c 	CAULIFLOWER SNOW BALL 

LB 19c 	GREEN BEANS KENTUCKY WONDER 

BOUNTY 
TOWELS 

JUMBO ROLL 

88c 

TOMATO 
SAUCE 

CONTADINA 8 OZ. 

EGGS 
SHURFRESH 

LARGE GRADE "A" 
DOZEN 

59c,  
SAUCE 

MINUITE MAID 12 OZ. 
31$1 ORANGE JUICE 

GANDY'S VANILLA 
ICE CREAM 50T BUCKET 

NESTLE 22 OZ. 
QUICK SYRUP ,131001'1 BOTTLE 

$1.29 
$4.89 
$1.39 

LB 39c 
12 OZ $1.79 

HEINZ 64 OZ. 
JUG CATSUP 
STARKIST 6'/2 OZ. 
TUNA 
CARNATION 16 OZ. 
COFFEE MATE 
LIPTON 2.5 OZ. 

$2.99 
fr;7,  89c 
@sti$1.99 
,D 79c DIP MIX ONION SOUP 16 CALIFORNIA 

$6.99 
$2.49 

31$1 MARGARINE QUARTERS SHURFRES 

VELVEETA SLICES KRAFT 

COMET CLEANSER 
LEMON 17 OZ. 

(PLASTIC CONTAINER) 

DETERGENT 
PALMOLIVE 12 OZ. 

DISHWASHING 

2P 1 
FANTASTIK 

CLEANER 
22 OZ. WITH SPRAYER 

2P3 
DR. PEPPER 

6 PACK CANS 

$129 

2/$  1 

(VIENNA SAUSAGE) 
LIBBY 5 OZ. 

3/$1 

cAnkpjukcKS NAPKINS — 
SCOTT ECONOMY 

PACK 300 CT. 
6.5 OZ. PRETZELS 

5 OZ. CHEESE BALLS 
7.5 OZ. CORN CHIPS 

4NNA S/(USAGE  

tOrr $ 1 79  
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