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Coach Well Pleased With 
Valley Patriots' Scrimmage 

The Valley Patriots began 
their 1983-84 season with Groom 
in a scrimmage there Friday 
night. 

Coach Ted Giddens says he is 
well pleased with the showing 
the Patriots made, although the 
score was 2-1 in Groom's favor. 
He says the Patriots had 215 
yards rushing to Groom's 108. 
The Patriots made 13 first downs 
to Groom's 6. Groom had five 

The Patriots, who missed a 
shot at the playoffs a year ago, 
have been chosen to dominate 
District 2-1A North Zone. The 
taste of post-season play, which 
Valley has enjoyed in past years, 
slipped away and the Pats don't 
want that to happen again this 
year. 

To keep up the recent tradi-
tion, Valley returns the Williams 
brothers—senior Tommy and so-
phomore Will in the backfield. 
Both started on Valley's 6-4 
squad in 1982. 

To help the Valley running 
game, four starters return on the 
offensive line—J. Dale Butler 
(6-1, 190), Keith Beavers (5-10, 
160), Daniel Ortiz (5-9, 200) and 
Walt Rice (6-1, 175(. Joining the 
four seniors is senior quarter-
back Kraig Cox, who won 
all-district honors as a defensive 
back last season. 

Larry Bob Clay, a 5-8, 155-
pound lineman, and defensive 
back Rex Morgan also return on 
defense along with Tommy Wil-
liams, a second-team all-district 
choice at linebacker. 

"Our defense will be our 
strength," Valley head coach Ted 
Giddens says. "We've got seven 
kids back on defense and in the 
other spots we should fill in with 
some pretty good kids. 

"Offense is my biggest worry. 
We lost our starting fullback and 
tailback. but we have the two 
Williams boys in there. We've 
got to come pretty quick on 
offense." 

2-1A North Zone Forecast 
1. Valley—With seven start-

ers back on both sides of the line 
from a 7-3 squad, need you ask 
why the Patriots are picked to 
win? 

2. Nazareth—The Swifts re-
turn even more experience—nine 
starters both ways—but a road 
game with Valley on October 7 
could keep Nazareth from the 
district title. 

3. Happy—The Cowboys rode 
to glory last year—an 8-2 regular 
season and a spot in the playoffs. 
But Happy could be a town 
without a frown again if it 
repeats last year's effort. 

4. Vega—The Longhorns' 

turnovers to Valley's two, and 
overall, the Patriots looked the 
best. 

Tommy Williams got off to a 
good start, running 45 yards for 
the one score. 

The Valley Tribune editor is 
expecting another good season 
for Valley. The fans can make a 
big difference in the team's 
performance. Let's get behind 
them in every way. 

stable has been depleted, with 
only one starter back. 

5. Sudan—The Hornets, with 
only three seniors in their lineup, 
still are young, but experienced 
with six starters back on offense 
and defense. 

6. Lazbuddie—The Longhorns 
return strength on the offensive 
line, but it won't be enough to 
better last year's 4-6 season. 

7. Amherst—The Bulldogs for- 
feited three games last year. 
They may want to forfeit some 
this season. 

Tory Giddens 
Scheduled For 
Surgery Sept. 20 

Tory Giddens, 21/2 year old son 
of Coach and Mrs. Ted Giddens, 
will go into Cook's Children's 
Hospital in Fort Worth Septem- 
ber 19 and is scheduled for 
surgery September 20. 

Tory was born with a bone 
disease in his leg and he has 
never known what it means to 
children to run and play. The 
bone is not developing normally 
after all this time of treatment, 
and the doctors' only hope now is 
to do a bone graft. It is the 
editor's understanding this will 
be taken from a bone-bank 
instead of from his person. 

Mr. and Mrs. Giddens have 
two healthy children, another 
boy and a girl. None of us know 
the mental and physical strain 
this couple has gone through. 
Many prayers have gone up for 
Tory and his parents, and this is 
the time to begin again in 
support of the family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Steve (Maurine) 
Stevens visited in Turkey with 
relatives and in Memphis with 
her mother, Mrs. U. F. Coker, 
sr., who is a resident of the 
Memphis Convalescent Home. 
They brought Mrs. Coker to her 
home in Turkey Wednesday for a 
visit and took her back Thurs- 
day. 

Save Your 
Campbell Labels 

"We the Women" has joined in 
the Campbell's "Labels for Re- 
creation" program. The ladies 
are saving labels to obtain free 
recreational equipment for Val- 
ley School. The area people are 
asked to join them in their effort. 
A collection boy will be located at 
Merrell's and at the First Nation- 
al Bank Community Room. The 
entire label is required, and they 
may be dropped in the boxes 
without any cutting. 

The following items are Camp- 
bell products: Campbell's Con- 
densed Soups, Campbell's Chun- 
ky Soups. Campbell's Soup for 
One, Campbell's Low Sodium 
Soups, Campbell's Bean pro- 
ducts, Campbell's Tomato Soup, 
Franco-American products, 
Swanson Canned Food products, 
Swanson Frozen Food products, 
V-8 Cocktail Vegetable Juice, V-8 
Low Sodium Cocktail Vegetable 
Juice, Recipe Dog Food pro- 
ducts. 

Please Bring 
Me Home! 

A nicely repainted "Yard of 
the Month" sign has once again 
run away from home. Will the 
persons who picked it up please 
see that our sign is returned to 
its original place. 

A reminder again: the sign is 
given in recognition of an out- 
standing yard in Quitaque for the 
purpose of motivating others in 
keeping the community looking 
attractive and one all can be 
proud of. Surely we all want the 
best community we can have— 
don't we?? 

Hall County 
Approved For 
Emergency Grazing 

Hall County has been approv- 
ed for special emergency grazing 
of CUA acres. 

Before the producer can graze 
the CUA acres he must go by the 
ASCS office and complete a form 
stating the number of cattle and 
farm numbers on which the CUA 
is located. No livestock purchas- 
ed or leased after August 1, 1983 
may be grazed on CUA under 
this program. 

Mrs. Rolf Wooten and children 
of Baytown spent last week 
visiting with Mr. and Mrs. E. L. 
Hill and other relatives. While 
they were here their home in 
Baytown received considerable 
damage from Hurricane Alicia. 
and also her husband's dental 
office sustained heavy damage. 
Bob Hill in nearby Friendswood 
received minor damage from the 
storm, it was learned. 

Howard Tant of Quitaque step-
ped out the door onto his porch 
Thursday morning of last week 
and almost stepped on the 
crayfish he is shown holding in 
his hand. This is a little unusual 
during such dry weather. The 
crayfish is of the crab family. 

Cindy Griffin 
Receives Degree 
With Honors 

Cindy Griffin graduated from 
West Texas State University in 
Canyon in the summer convoca-
tion exercises. The ceremony 
took place in the Civic Center 
Auditorium in Amarillo Satur-
day, August 13. Cindy received 
the bachelor of general studies 
degree. Having maintained a 4.0 
average throughout her college 
career, she graduated summa 
cum laude, with the highest 
honors. 

Those attending the exercises 
in her behalf were her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Griffin of 
Quitaque, Russ and Denise Grif-
fin of Canyon, Bernice Thurman 
of Denton, Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Griffin, Quitaque, Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Griffin and Donna, Lubbock, 
and Lisa Jernigan of Plainview. 

Cindy was a member of the 
Alpha Chi National Honor So-
ciety at WTSU and a resident 
assistant at Hudspeth Hall for 
three semesters. 

Miss Griffin will leave Septem-
ber 1 to attend Asbury Theolog-
ical Seminary in Wilmore, Ken-
tucky. She will be working on her 
master of arts degree in religion. 

VALLEY STUDENTS 

ENROLLED IN COLLEGES 

AND UNIVERSITIES 

Joey Barefield is enrolled at 
West Texas State University at 
Canyon. 

0 	  

Tink and Estelle Lane were in 
Greeley, Colorado visiting their 
son, Keith, and his family during 
the first two weeks in August. 

Turkey Lions 
View Film On 
Drug Abuse 

A film on drug abuse entitled, 
"Busted," was shown by Boss 
Lion W. L. Armstrong when the 
club met Tuesday at noon in the 
Bob Wills Cafeteria. There were 
16 Lion members present, and 
visitors included Cristi Calvert, 
guest of Sweetheart Kaylene 
Green, Jim Davis of Silverton 
and formerly of Turkey, the 
guest of Lion J. T. Mullin and 
Glen Braune, ag teacher, was the 
guest of Lion Wayne Loury. 

Invocation was given by Lion 
Leroy Stone, the pledge to the 
flag was led by Lion Byron 
Young and Lion Roy Patterson 
won the pot of gold. Lion 
Patterson led the group in the 
singing of "Hail, Hail, the Lions 
Are All Here" and "America." 

During the business session 
the group voted to have the 
Light Bulb and Candy Sale 
combined for sometime in Octo-
ber. 

Faye Armstrong served a 
delicious meal of ham, potato 
salad, glazed carrots, green 
beans and peach cobbler with ice 
cream. Those present enjoyed 
the meal immensely. The club 
adjourned to meet again on 
September 13. 

QUITAQUE GRADUATING 

CLASS OF 1953 

HAS REUNION 

The 1953 graduating class of 
Quitaque High School held its 
30-year reunion in Quitaque on 
Saturday, August 20. The affair 
was held in the First National 
Bank Community Room. 

Those present for the noon 
barbecue and day of visiting and 
lots of reminiscing were Alton 
and Glorianna (Neatherlin) Lane, 
Lavona Mae (Lewis) Baird, Wil-
lie and Clara Mae (Smith) 
Bradshaw and daughter, Anna 
Leta, Albert and Jan Ramsey, 
Stewart and Lavada McCracken, 
Gus and Pat Gibson, Elbert and 
Gaye Sperry, Pat and Wanda 
Bean, Richard and Gaye Eddle-
man. 

Those visiting in the afternoon 
were Jimmy and Clara Ruth 
Davidson, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Smith. 

A good time was reported by 
all attending. They expressed 
their appreciation for the use of 
the nice community room. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Bain 
attended a Bain family reunion 
Saturday at the Community 
Building in Sunray. 

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Lyles of 
Elk City, Oklahoma spent the 
weekend in Turkey visiting their 
mothers, Mrs. Alice Fuston and 
Mrs. W. E. Lyles. 

Valley Predicted To Win 
District 2-1A North Zone 
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WHILE SUPPLIES LAST! SELF SERVE GAS 

OPEN 24 HOURS FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE! 

PRICES EFFECTIVE 	AUGUST 25 -27.1983 
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ICE 

1 /2 GAL. $ 1 79 
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COOKED FOOD SPECIAL OF THE WEEK  
Chicken Pattie 
SANDWICH 	99 

EACH 

lbs. 
ALPO DOG FOOD 
Betty Crocker Moist 
CAKE MIX 

$1.05 

2/$1.09 

'`- FRUIT 
i, I r 
hilt 

GALLON 8 
BORDEN'S LA FAMOUS 

TORTILLA CHIPS 
LARGE $ 	39 

BAG 

DRINKS 
C  9 

SHURFINE CHARCOAL 	69c 
Shurfine 
MAC & CHEESE 	6/$1.00 
Shurfine 
SANDWICH BAGS 	3/$1.00 
Del Monte 
TOMATO SAUCE 	6/$1.00 
LETTUCE 	lb. 	39c 

TOMATOES 	lb. 	39c 

coke  COCA COLA 
b---/1111 

i 

9 C  Ccok 
2 Liter 8 	1 a 

   

HEY KIDS! JOIN THE ALLSUP'S DOORBELL BRIGADE 
FOR MDAI AUGUST 27 AND AUGUST 28.19831 

   

 

CHECK YOUR HEARTY CAMP EMU FOR DETIOLSI 

"CARING MAKES GOOD NEIGHBORS" 

 

   

The regular meeting for the 
Quitaque Senior Citizens Asso-
ciation will be at 7:00 p.m. 
Thursday, September 1, and 
everyone is urged to be present.. 

In a called meeting, Monday, 
August 15, a very informative 
program was presented by the 
Association Director, Lolla Belle 
Harmon. She, Margie Boyles and 
Anna Mae Smith had attended a 
Workshop in Amarillo held the 
week before in the A&M Exten-
sion Building. The man and 
woman who instructed the work-
shop were from San Antonio and 
the ladies came back enthused 
and with goals for the local 
Association to work toward. 
They received manuals which 
will benefit them throughout the 
year in local work. 

Mrs. Harmon used a diagram 
on the blackboard to tell of some 
of the things they had learned 
which will help to direct the work 
in the local association. 

Everyone  55  years of age  or 
older is invited to be present and 
help in the work and then will 
come  the recreation. 

Quitaque Senior 
Citizens To 
Meet Sept. 1 

Comptroller Mails 
Rebate Checks 

State Comptroller Bob Bullock 
has sent checks totaling $103 
million in local sales tax pay-
ments to 974 cities that levy the 
one-percent sales tax. 

"So far this year. we are just a 
little ahead of 1982 payments," 
Bullock said. "This is about 
where we expected to be by this 
time when we put out our 
revenue estimate for the state." 

Bullock said seven of the 20 
Texas cities that collect the most 
local sales tax—Houston, El 
Paso, Beaumont, Odessa, Abil-
ene, Midland and Tyler—contin-
ue to lag behind last year's 
receipts. But the August pay-
ment to all seven showed they 
had gained ground since last 
month. 

Houston got the biggest check, 
$19.6 million. Dallas received 
$11.6 million. San Antonio receiv-
ed $5.8 million, bringing the 
city's 1983 payments 9.3 percent 
above 1982 levels. 

Austin's $3.9 million check 
brought that city's 1983 total to 
$19 million, up 15.9 percent over 
1982. 

Fort Worth's check for $3.5 
million was up 6.2 percent over 
last August's payment. 

Bullock also sent August re-
bates to the state's two Metro-
politan Transit Authorities. The 
Houston MTA got $21.9 million, 
down from last August's $22.1 
million payment. The San Anton 
io MTA got $3.3 million compar 
ed with $2.9 million last August. 

The August checks were for 
taxes collected on sales math- in 
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June and reported to the Comp-
troller by the end of July. 

In Briscoe County, the pay-
ment for this period was 
$5,726.79, as compared to 
$4,925.39 for the same period last 
year. The 1983 payments to date 
total $19,857.03. as compared to 
$23,313.71 in 1982, this year's 
payment being 14.83% less than 
for the same period in 1982. 

Quitaque received $2,198.17 

this period, as compared with 
$1,846.43 for the same period last 
year. The 1983 payments to date 
have been $5,836.17, 30.89% less 
than the $8,444.46 payments for 
the same period in 1982. 

Silverton's rebate check was 
$3,528.62 for this period, up from 
the $3,078.96 received for the 
same period in 1982. The 1983 
payments to date total 
$14,020.86, off 5.71% from the 
$14,869.25 received for the same 
period in 1982. 

A "furnace" in a plant? Be-
cause skunk cabbages often 
begin to bloom before the snow 
melts, the plant produces its own 
heat when blooming, which melts 
the snow around it, says National 
Wildlife's Ranger Rick magazine. 
This heat also attracts insects 
chilled on nippy nights, which 
may pollinate the plant. 

THE VALLEY TRIBUNE 

Food Preparation 
Methods Compared 

Researchers at the United 
States Department of Agricul-
ture's consumer nutrition labora-
tory compared a variety of foods 
prepared in preheated and non-
preheated ovens and found few 
significant differences in the 
quality or size of the items. 
reports home economist Bonnie 
Piernot. 

The non-preheated ovens re-
quired five minutes or less extra 
baking time than the preheated 
ovens, says Ms. Piernot, who is 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, Texas A&M 
University System. 

The energy savings from not 
pre-heating averaged about 10 
percent. "Overall," Ms. Piernot 

THURSDAY, AUGUST 25, 1983 

says, "the findings confirm that 
preheating the oven is not 
essential for good quality taking, 
so it's an unnecessary use of 
energy." 

To reach under bark and into 
wood, the European green wood-
pecker, says National Wildlife's 
Ranger Rick magazine, can stick 
its tongue out 25 inches beyond 
its beak. 

--- 
 birds and animals 

evolved on nearly identical time 
schedules, there are more than 
twice as many different species 
of birds, than animals alive 
today, reports National Wildlife 
magazine. At last count, there 
were over 8,700 species of birds, 
ranging in size from the condor 
to the tiny hummingbird, com-
pared to 4,000 species of mam-
mals. 
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MR. AND MRS. ROY SMITH 

The Roy Smiths Observe 
Golden Wedding Anniversary 

Today A New Abstract 
To Your Property 

Would Cost You From 
$500 to $1000 

For Only $6.00 Per Year 
This Valuable Instrument 

Can Be In A Safe, Fireproof 
Safety Deposit Box 

In The Vault 
Of Your 

First National Bank 
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On Sunday. August 7, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Smith were honored by 
their children with a reception 
held at the Quitaque Community 
Center. 

The serving table was laid 
with a handmade cutwork linen 
cloth and centered with an 
arrangement of pastel silk flow-
ers. The two-tiered wedding cake 
was decorated with white and 
yellow roses and was topped 
with  a  miniature bride and 
groom and the golden wedding 
emblem. This was served with 
banana slush punch, nuts and 
mints from crystal and silver 
appointments. The napkins bore 
the couple's names and the 
emblem "50. -  Serving were the 
couple's granddaughter. Kathy 
Farley of Turkey, and a niece. 
Elizabeth May of Felt. Oklaho-
ma. 

Registering the guests was a 
granddaughter, Miss Anna Leta 
Bradshaw of Floydada. 

A grandson, J. Royce Brad-
shaw, took pictures throughout 
the afternoon. 

Those attending from out of 
town were Mrs. Bertha Turner, 
Amarillo; Mr. and Mrs. J. W. 
Montgomery. Waxahachie; Mrs. 
Emma Price, Durant, Oklahoma; 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Morris, Tuba; 
Mr. and Mrs. Wilson Reed, 

A Land Bank 
Loan 

Long-term 
credit 

for buying, 
building, 

or remodeling 

1806) 983-2480 
105 S. Wall Street 

Floydada. Texas 79235 
Tommy R. Ogden, Presiden 

Law ndale. California; Bobby 
Montgomery, Mr. and Mrs. Don-
ald May, Felt, Oklahoma, Mr. 
and Mrs. Walter Coventry. An-
gie and Julie. Mr. and Mrs. 
James Baird, Lubbock; Mr. and 
Mrs. Coy Dunn, Dimmitt; Mr. 
and Mrs. John Smith, Plainview; 
Mrs. Valarie Matthews, Little 
Rock, Arkansas; Mr. and Mrs. 
Guy Smith. Mr. and Mrs. Leon 
Lane. Turkey; Mrs. Pat Carnes. 
Mrs. Kathy Farley, Turkey; Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Hunter, Flomot; 
Mr. and Mrs. Steve Barrett, 
Alex, Michele and Marka. Kress, 
and Mrs. H. W. Cross, Com-
merce. 

LINES FROM 
Y 
N 

A 

Lynda Fogerson 
Briscoe County Extension Agent 

The "good ole summertime" 
may bring discomfort and illness 
in the way of food poisoning if 
you fail to take precautions with 
food. There are four main types 
of bacteria which can cause food-
borne illness—salmonella. clostri-
duim perfringens, staphylococ-
cus, and clostriduim bolulinuim. 
Only one of these is usually 
fatal—bolulism. The others gen-
erally cause discomfort for 24-28 
hours. 

Salmonella is one of the most 
common with over two million 
cases per year in the United 
States. It is usually found in raw 
meats, poultry, eggs, milk, fish 
and products made from these. 
These bacteria are destroyed by 
heat, so proper cooking and 
thorough heating of leftovers 
will help prevent this type of 
food poisoning. 

Clostriduim perfringens bac-
teria are more wide-spread ev-
erywhere than any other disease-
causing micro-organism. To av-
oid this illness, again cook meats 
properly and keep hot (above 140 
degrees) when serving or refrig-
erate (below 40 degrees). Thor-
oughly re-heat leftovers and 
bring gravy to a rolling boil 
before serving. 

Staph organisms are also ev- 

erywhere, even on your skin. 
They also multiply on meats. 
poultry, egg products, tuna, 
potato or macaroni salads, cream 
pastries, and sandwich fillings. If 
they multiply to high levels, they 
form a toxin which cannot be 
"boiled away." Though bolulism 
is very rare, 700 people have died 
since 1925 from eating contamin-
ated home-canned products. The 
primary means of prevention is 
to process home-canned low-acid 
foods (meat, poultry, vegetables) 
at the correct pressure for the 
recommended time in a pressure 
canner. A high temperature for a 
specified time is required to 
destroy this toxin. 

Do not eat food from bent, 
leaking or bulging cans. Do not 
taste a food you are unsure of. 
When in doubt, throw it out. 

Keep hot foods hot—above 140 
degrees—and cold foods cold—
below 40 degrees F. Bacteria 
multiply rapidly when food is left 
sitting at room temperature. 

"Old wine and an old 
friend are good provisions." 

George Herbert 

For All Your Construction Needs 
Call 

MIKE ROGERS CONSTRUCTION 

817 937-8771, or if no answer, 817 937-3784 

Childress, Texas 

Carpenter Work, Remodeling 
Concrete, Tile Work 8 4tp 



WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS 
WE ACCEPT MANUFACTURERS COUPONS 

_ _ _ 
Specials Good 
August 26-27 

LB. 

FRESH GROUND BEEF 
Family Pak-38 or more 

lb. 99c 
Guaranteed 73% Lean 

lb. $1.19 

Heavy Grain Fed Beef 
Whole in the Bag 

BRISKETS 
8 to 12 lb. ay. 

lb. $1.29 

442 oz. Underwood Devil. 
HAM 79c 
41/2 oz. Underwood Chick. 
SPREAD 79c 
41/2 oz. Underwood Roast 
BEEF SPREAD 79c 
4 1/2 oz. Underwood Corn 
BEEF SPREAD 79c 
4 oz. Figaro 
LIQUID SMOKE 2/89c 
16 oz. Heinz Smoky 
BAR-B-QUE SAUCE 89c 
10 oz. Wolf Hot Dog 
SAUCE 	 2/89c 
9 oz. Kraft 
MUSTARD 	39c 
10 lb. Royal Oak 
CHARCOAL 	$2.49 
25 et. Hefty 8 7/8" 
FOAM PLATES 	89c 
12'x25" Reynold's Stan. 
FOIL 	 59c 
8 oz. Gar & Ch/Tst On 
Cuc/Ital Herb Kraft Phil. 
DRESSINGS 	89c 
12 oz. Choc/Pine/Straw/ 
Cara/Bttrsct/Fudge 
5 oz. Walnut Kraft Ice 
CREAM TOPPINGS 89c 

THE VALLEY TRIBUNE 

A 
2-4 lb. Average 

Oscar Mayer Orig/Nach lb.  
CHEESE HOT DOGS $1.79 
Oscar Mayer 8 oz. Slic. 
HAM AND CHEESE $1.39 
Oscar Mayer 8 oz. Slic 
CHOPPED HAM $1.39 
Hillshire Farm Reg/Pol 
Smoked Sausage lb. $2.19 
Heavy Grain Fed Boneless 
Beef Chuck Roast 	$1.69 

8 qt. Minute Maid Crys. 
PINK LEMONADE $2.79 
46 oz. Texsun Pink 
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE 79c 
9 oz. Kis/Min/Reese's 
HERSHEY 	$1.49 
12 oz. Del Monte WK 
GOLD CORN 	2/99c 
16 oz. Johnson Shout 
PRE-WASH 	$1.99 
16 oz. For No-Wax Floors 
BRITE 	 $1.49 
17 oz. Johnson 
FAVOR 	 98c 
32 oz. Kraft Chilled Florida 
ORANGE JUICE 99c 
14 oz. Banquet Choc/Coco/ 
Ban/Lem 
CREAM PIES 	79c 
7 oz. Ore Ida Onion 
RINGERS 	 59c 
VE gal. Sq. Ctn. As. Fly. 
Shurfresh Ice Cream $1.49 
12 oz. Banquet Pat/St/Nug 
CHICKEN 	$2.29 
16 oz. Kraft Slices 
VELVEETA 	$2.39 
8 oz. Kraft Philadelphia 
CREAM CHEESE 89c 
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COOKED 

Decker's 
Quality 

MEAT FRANKS 
DECKER BONELESS 89c 
HALF 

RANCH STYLE 

Hams 

Bathroom „.„(.19 
Tissue 4 ROLL 

PK G  

Oi l 24 oz. — 20e Off Label 

32 oz. 	30's Child. Chew. Tab. 
Polish/Plain/Kosh TYLENOL 	$1.89 

VLASIC 	30's Plas Strip/Sh Strip 
DILL PICKLES Adhesive Bandages 

$1.09 	BAND-AID 	$1.29 
6 oz. Insect Repellent 
OFF! 
12 oz. Flying Insect' il Killer 
RAID $2.29 
16 oz. Ant & Roach Killer 
RAID $2.29 

PURE VEGETABLE 

'AIN JUICE 	 20 oz. Crushed/Sliced/Chunk 

-fineapple 

18 oz. 

Om
$1.09 

TOASTIES 	19  POST 

Rite  Whipped Sho 4r t2e noi 

CAN 

Del Monte 71  

3 slap BEANS 

anch 
 

Lyle 
VAC PAK ALL GRINDS 

Shurfine 
Coffee CAN 

sson 

AT PRINTS 

29 oz. 
Del Monte YC 
Slices/Halves 
PEACHES 

' 89c 

1 
B & I 

T 

John ] 

26 oz. As 
CORM 

80 Asst 
CREAM 1 
Qt. Shurf 
SALAD I 
2 lbs. 
SHEDD 

1 lb. Parkay Qtrs. 
MARGARINE 	2/$1.00 
10 ct. Flak/FI Bttrmlk/ 
FVBttr Tastin Hung. Jack 
BISCUITS 	2/51.00 
10 oz. Ex Sharp/Sharp 
Kraft Sticks 
CRACKER BARREL $1.99 

We Reserve The Right 
To Limit Quantities 

ASST., WHITE 

Kleenex 710 
Tissu e F  
Maxwell g29 
House 10  oczo FSEJTEANT 

N  

Regular Sliced 
Oscar Mayer 

MEAT BOLOGNA 
99c 

24 oz. 
Del Monte 
CATSUP 	WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITIES 	 

89c 

Giant 11 DETERGENT 25 OFF LABE! . 

wCheer 
ASSORTED-DECORATOR-AR' 

Scott Jumbo 
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POTATOE1 

 California 
 ORANGE 

10 bag N 

303 can In 
Shurfine 3i 
FRUIT CD vo.,........ . 

.............. 

11111■14 

California 
PEACHE 
Texas 
CABBAG 
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MAURO ANNOUNCES 
IMPROVED INSURANCE 
POLICY FOR VETERANS 

Texas Land Commissioner 
Garry Mauro announced the 
Veterans Land Board will pro-
vide an improved group credit 
life insurance program to veter-
ans who have obtained loans 
through the Veterans Land Pro-
gram. 

The Veterans Land Board in 
its August 15 meeting awarded a 
contract to Pruco Life Insurance 
of Texas for the group credit life 
insurance policy for the Veterans 
Land Program. 

This is a dramatic improve -

ment in our insurance program 
which Texas veterans will be 
happy to see," commented board 
member Jack Rains of Houston. 
This continues our policy of 

running the Veterans Land Pro-
gram like a business." 

Of the seven bids submitted, 
the board felt Pruco provided 
rates that benefitted most veter-
ans. The new rates will lower 
premiums as much as 65 percent 
for many age groups who parti-
cipate in the insurance program. 
For the first time ever, veterans 
over the age of 65 will be able to 
obtain coverage. 

The current average age of all 
contract holders presently parti-
cipating in the optional insurance 
program is 53.9 years of age. 
Veterans under the age of 49 will 
get a decrease in their present 
rate. Participating veterans can 
expect to be provided with 
competitive rates with potential 
premium reductions based on 
actual claim experience. 

"The benefits derived from 
this coverage will allow us to 
continue operating on a sound, 
business-like basis without any 
additional cost to the taxpayer," 
stated Veterans Land Board 
Chairman Mauro. "This policy 
will not only attract more 
veterans to the program but also 
encourage participation by lend-
ing institutions and sellers." 

In other action by the board, a 
non-refundable fee of $75 will be 
charged for each bid submitted 
on tracts offered in the forfeited 
land sale on September 30. 
Forfeited land information bro-
chures containing descriptions 
and locations of approximately 
100 tracts in the sale will be 
issued at no charge on August 31. 
Prior contract holders of the 
forfeited tracts failed to comply 
with a July 22 deadline to bring 
payments to a current basis for 
reinstatement and the tracts 
were ordered for sale. 

"If we are going to continue to 
offer generous terms and low 
interest rates to our Texas 
veterans, we must maintain a 
strong delinquency collection pol-
icy. If we want to continue to 
close loans within 90 days. 
veterans will have to make their 
payments on time," Mauro sta 
ted. 

A Wyoming economist esti-
mates acid rain is costing approx-
imately $5 billion a year in 
damage to forests, soil, crops, 
buildings, fish and other aquatic 
life, and drinking water, reports 
National Wildlife magazine. 

0 	  

Fifty million acres of the 
world's tropical forests—an area 
about the size of Great Britain—
are destroyed each year as 
forests are cleared for cattle 
pastures, timber and human 
settlements, reports Interns-
tionai Wildlife magazine. 



B & B SATELLITE COMPANY 
808 Main 

Silverton, Texas 

Tempered Aluminum Dish 
Various Sizes 

Electronic Equipment 

Local Installation & Service 

Contact: 

John Bowman Anthony Kingery 
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SCHOOL FREE LUNCH 

PROGRAM ANNOUNCED 

The Turkey -Quitaque ISD to-
day announced its policy for free 
and reduced-price meals for 
children unable to pay the full 
price of meals served under the 
National School. School Break-
fast programs. 

Local school officials have 
adopted the following family size 
income criteria for determining 
ehgthi lit 

Children from families whose 
income is at or below the levels 
shown are eligible for free or 
reduced price meals. 

In the operation of the child 
feeding programs •  no child will 
be discriminated against because 
of race. sex, color, or national 
origin. 

Under the provision of the 
policy the Superintendent of 
Schools will review the applica-
tions and determine eligibility. If 
a parent is dissatisfied with the 

Family 
Size 

ANNUAL 

Reduced-Price 
Free Meals 	Meals 

MONTHLY 

Reduced-Price 
Free Meals 	Meals 

1 $0- 6,318 6,318 	8.991 $0- 	527 $ 	527- 	750 
0- 8,502 8,502 12.099 0 	709 709-1,009 

3 0-10,686 10,686-15,207 0- 	891 891 1,268 
4 0-12.870 12,870-18,315 0.1,073 1.073-1,527 
5 0.15,054 15,054-21,423 0-1.255 1,255-1,786 
6 0 17,238 17.238 24,531 0-1,437 1,437-2,045 
7 0-19,422 19,422.27,639 0 1,619 1,619-2,304 
8 0 21,606 21.606-30,747 0-1,801 1.801 2,563 

Each Additional 
Family Member $2.184 $3,108 $182 $259 

INCOME ELIGIBILITY GUIDELINES FOR SCHOOL LUNCH PROGRAM 

ruling of the official, he may 
make a request to the President 
of the Board of Trustees for a 
hearing to appeal the decision. 

The central office of the school 
has a copy of the complete policy 
which may be reviewed by any 
interested party. 

Social Security 
In 

Briscoe County 
BY 

TERRY J. CLEMENTS 

A person who pays a house-
hold employee at least $50 in 
cash during a 3-month quarter is 
considered an employer for So-
cial Security purposes. The em-
ployer is required to deduct 
Social Security taxes and report 
the wages paid, including cash 

Ink mu fOOD SPECIALS 
Specials For August 26-27 

26 oz. Assorted Pet Ritz 
COBBLERS $1.69 

16 oz. Heinz Hamburger 
SLICED DILLS 	 79c 

8 oz. Asst. Flvrs. Kraft Soft 
CREAM CHEESE 89c FINE MEATS 
Qt. Shurfine 
SALAD DRESSING 89c 

Bone In 
CHUCK ROAST 	lb. 	$1.49 

2 lbs. 
SHEDD SPREAD $1.09 

Wright's Sliced Slab 
BACON 	lb. 	$1.29 

Fresh 
,  Produce 

Assorted Cuts Family Pak 
PORK CHOPS 	lb. 	$1.59 

California 
PEACHES 	 lb. -19c 

Sirloin 
STEAK 	 lb. 	$2.69 

Texas 
CABBAGE 	 lb. 19c 

Rib Eye 
STEAK 	 lb. 	$4.19 

California Sunkist 
ORANGES 	 lb. 39c 

Fresh Lean Ground 
HAMBURGER 	lb. 	$1.39 

10# bag No. 1 Russett 
POTATOES $1.69 

32 oz. Banquet 
FRIED CHICKEN 	$2.99 

303 can In Heavy Syrup 
Shurfine 303 can 
FRUIT COCKTAIL 59c 

16 oz. 
Fr. SI. or Cut Green Giant 
GREEN BEANS 	2 for 89c 

C & L FOOD 	Double Stamps on Wednesdays 
We Give Green Stamps 

MEMBER STORE di ifflff28 

payments made to cover the cost 
of bus fare, meals or a room. 

So that the necessary reports 
may be made accurately and on 
time, employers should keep a 
record of the name, address and 
Social Security number of each 
household worker, as well as the 
amount of wages paid. For 1983, 
both employer and employee are 
required to pay Social Security 
taxes of 6.70 percent on cash 
wages up to $35,700. Reporting 
forms and instructions on how to 

complete them can be obtained 
from the Internal Revenue Ser-
vice Center. 

There are a number of impor-
tant exceptions to Social Secur-
ity coverage for household em-
ployees. For example, payment 
for household work performed by 
a husband or wife or by a child 
under 21 is not covered under 
Social Security. However, wages 
paid a parent for similar work 
may be covered under certain 
circumstances. 

Employees of a hotel or 
rooming house are not subject to 
the requirement that a household 
worker earn at least $50 during a 
calendar quarter; all wages paid 
these employees must be report-
ed. 

Household workers employed 
on a farm that is operated for 
profit comprise another special 
group. Wages paid these employ-
ees must be reported if they 
amount to $150 or more for the 
year. Wages must also be 
reported if the household em-
ployee works at least 20 days 
during the year on a time 
basis—by the hour, day, week or 
month—even if total annual 
wages amount to less than $150. 

Question: Is a baby sitter 
considered a household employee 
covered by Social Security? 

Answer: For Social Security 
purposes, a baby sitter is consid-
ered a household employee, and 
wages must be reported if they 
amount to $50 or more in cash 
during a 3-month calendar quar-
ter. 

If you have a question concern-
ing household employees or a 
question on any Social Security 
matter please call us at 293-4371. 
If you need to visit our office our 
address is 1401-B West 5th 
Street in Plainview. 

q‘es,ted tat 
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Tips To Help You 
Washday blues needn't 

be sung around your house 
if you follow a few simple 
laundry rules. For instance, 
close hooks and zippers to 
prevent snags. Mend rips 
and tears. Check pockets 
for tissues and other "treas-
ures." Read care labels be-
fore washing any garment. 
They give washing instruc- 

WEEKLY 

Reduced.Priee 
Free Meals 
	

Meals 
$0-122 $122 173 
0-164 164 233 
0-206 206-293 
0-248 248-353 
0-290 290-412 
0-332 332-472 
0.374 374-532 
0-416 416-592 

$42 	 $60 

BRIGHTER SOYBEAN 

OUTLOOK FORECAST 

Earlier gloom regarding the 
soybean outlook has changed to 
improved price prospects for the 
1983 crop. Factors brightening 
the soybean picture are a smaller 
than expected crop and dry 
weather in the Midwest that has 
dampened grain prospects, says 

an economist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service. 
Texas A&M University System. 

U. S. soybean acreage is down 
12 percent from earlier esti-
mates, and yields will likely be 
down due to the dry weather. 
Furthermore. corn acreage is 
down sharply, so increased feed 
demands from expanding hog 
and poultry operations should 
boost soybean prices. 

SELECT CATTLE FOR 

FUNCTIONAL EFFICIENCY 

Selecting cattle for functional 
efficiency—fertility, growthabil-
ity and carcass quality—is the 
key to a profitable beef business, 
an official from the University of 
Pretoria, South Africa. said at 
the recent International Ranch-
ers Roundup at San Angelo. 

Dr. Cas Maree also empha-
sized such factors as adaptability 
and physical and structural 
soundness as critical to produc-
tion economics. Cows should not 
have a beefy appearance while 
bulls should be capable of produ-
cing live fertile sperm, have a 
high level of sexual drive, and be 
able to serve a large number of 
females. 

Keep frozen poultry hard. 
frozen until time to thaw, 
and cook promptly after 
thawing. 

Lions and fiber content. 
• • • 

It can be easy to be on 
the right scent when you 
want to control odors in 
children's clothes. Simply 
use a safe laundry addi-
tive such as 20 Mule Team 
Borax. It makes for natural-
ly cleaner, fresher smelling 

diapers and outerwear and 
bed linens as well. 

• to * 

Sort your laundry before 
washing. Colors should be 
separated...whites, lights and 
darks. That goes for fabrics, 
too...delicates, synthetics, 
permanent press and non-
synthetics. New garments, 
especially bright or dark 
colors, often contain excess 
dye. Wash them separately 
the first few times to re-
move that excess. 

• " 	• '''' v" ' ' 	 • 	" 	 • 
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ALLSUP'S GRADUATES 

ASSISTANT MANAGER 

Faye Stockton (left) receives 
her diploma from Rick Garris, 
instructor, for successfully com-
pleting the Allsup's Assistant 
Manager Training Course. Held 
at the company's home offices in 
Clovis, New Mexico, the class is a 
requirement for all Allsup's 
assistant managers. According to 
Garris, "The training prepares 
individuals for future advance- 

Dove Season 
To Open 
Sept. 1 

The Texas Parks and Wildlife 
Commission has approved a new 
three-way zone alignment for 
dove hunting for the upcoming 
season. The dove season starts 
September 1 this year in Hall 
County. 

Meeting in Austin recently, 
the commission established the 
Panhandle, Central and Rio 
Grande zones. The new align-
ment replaces the two-zone sys-
tem which had been in effect 
since 1946. 

Ron George, dove progr am 
leader for the Parks Depart-
ment, told commission members 
the three-zone system was de-
signed to provide optimum hunt-
ing opportunity for hunters when 
the birds are available, within 
the contest of proper manage-
ment. 

Significant changes brought 
about by the new alignment 
include a September 1 opening 
date for a large portion of 
Southwest Texas which formerly 
had the later south zone date; a 
straight 70-day season for the 
Panhandle-South Plains and 
much of North Texas; and 
allowance for two white-winged 
doves in the daily bag limit. 

The new system also utilizes 
highways for boundary lines for 
better delineation of zone boun-
daries. Under the two-zone sys-
tem, county boundaries were 
used. 

The Panhandle zone mourning 
dove season will be September 
1-November 9; the Central Zone 
season will be September -Oc-
tober 30 and January 7-16, 1984: 
the Rio Grande season will be 
September 17-November 5 and 
January 7-2'2. 1984. 

ment by teaching them proper 
food handling, cooked food pro-
cedures, store cleanliness and 
maintenance as well as public 
relations. It's designed to pro-
duce a more professional em-
ployee who can better serve the 
customer and community." Ms. 
Stockton will return to her store 
at Main and 9th in Turkey to 
assume the duties of assistant 
manager. Allsup's Convenience 
Stores, Inc. is an Equal Oppor-
tunity Employer. 

The statewide bag limit will be 
12 doves, not to include more 
than two white-winged doves. 
Shooting hours will be one-half 
hour before sunrise and last to 
sunset. 

As in the past, all persons who 
hunt white-winged doves will be 
required to have a special stamp, 
in addition to a valid hunting 
license. The stamp requirement 
applies to any person taking or 
hunting white-winged doves 
statewide. 

A hunting license is not 
required of persons hunting 
doves in the county of residence. 

The Panhandle zone runs 
north from interstate Highway 
30 all across Texas to Texarkana. 

Mrs. Jarrell Rice and daugh-
ter, Nadine, spent from Thurs-
day until Sunday in Dallas 
attending Market. Mrs. Rice 
reports her daughter proved to 
be great help in making selec-
tions. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clovis Hill of 
Amarillo were guests for lunch 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
A. C. Barrett. Sunday. 

Afternoon visitors were the 
Glynn Barrett family. Mr. and 
Mrs. Buddy Price of Childress 
stopped by for a visit also. 

Recent visitors in the Cecil 
Price home were their daughter. 
Mrs. Margie Trent of Memphis. 
She was on vacation, and she 
spent from Sunday to Tuesday. 
Joe Edd Price of Amarillo visited 
his parents, then last Sunday 
evening, Mr. and Mrs. Buddy 
Price of Childress were guests 
for the evening meal with his 
parents.  

In 1921 and 1 92 2, 
"Man-O-War", the legendary 
race-horse, won 20 of 21 
starts! 

THE VALLEY TRIBUNE 

WITH THE SICK 

Mr. and Mrs. Buddy Morris 
returned to their home Monday. 
Buddy had been at Lockney 
General Hospital two weeks. 
Mrs. Morris had to be hospitaliz-
ed for a few days. She returned 
to Lockney Tuesday for a check-
up with her doctor. 

• 
Willie Woods continues treat-

ment at Lockney General Hospi-
tal. According to report from his 
family, he may be able to return 
home in a day or two. 

Joe Tiffin continues treatment 
at Lockney General Hospital and 
it is reported he has improved 
and may be able to return home 
soon. 

• 
Jay Gray, son of Mr. and Mrs. 

Don Gray, was taken by Quita-
que ambulance to Floydada Sat-
urday night after he had fallen 
from a tree and hit his head. He 
was checked by the doctor and 
was permitted to return home, 
his mother reports. 

Elgin Conner, Walter Wayne 
Taylor and David Brunson ans-
wered the ambulance call and 
made the run. 

• 
It is reported P. John Monk is 

in Lubbock undergoing tests as 
we go to press. He and his wife 
went up over the weekend and 
visited the Clyde Monks before 
he began the tests Monday. 

Mrs. Clovis Hill of Amarillo 
underwent two hours of surgery 
in Amarillo Wednesday morning. 
It was reported to the Tribune 
that she came through the 
surgery fine, and doctors are 
hopeful. 

Kami Owens 
Celebrates Birthday 

Kami Brooke Owens of Plain-
view celebrated her second birth-
day anniversary Friday night 
with a dinner party on the patio. 

Those present were her great-
grandmother, Mrs. Olive Owens, 
88, of Plainview; her grandpar-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Charles Scott 
of Seminole and Mrs. Lottie 
Owens of Quitaque; her aunt. 
Mrs. Bob Brotherton of Semin-
ole; her uncle and aunt, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dwain Henderson, and 
cousins, Wayne and Zane of 
Silverton. 

Kami enjoyed opening all the 
gifts more than anything (except 
eating corn off the cob). 

She was to have another party 
for her little friends at McDon-
ald's Saturday (her birthday) 
with a big cake and McDonald's 
clown and all the trimmings. 

Mary Brunson of Lubbock 
spent the weekend in Quitaque 
visiting her parents, Mr.- and 
Mrs. James Brunson, other rela-
tives and friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hayden Carter 
and Mrs. George Lay of Para-
gould, Arkansas spent Saturday 
night and Sunday with the Ralph 
Carters in Quitaque. Mrs. Floye 
McCracken joined them Satur-
day night and again Sunday for a 
visit. The Hayden Carters and 
Mrs. Lay drove to Lubbock 
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Sunday afternoon, accompanied 
by Melanie Carter, small daugh-
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Mel Carter, 
who had been visiting her 
grandparents. She returned to 
her home. The Carters spent the 
night with the Clyde Monks. 
They were enroute to California 
on a visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Robert McFad-
den and children of Kaufman 
spent Saturday night in the home 
of their cousins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Elgin Conner and children, in 
Quitaque. The McFaddens were 
returning home from a vacation 
trip to California. They attended 
church services and had lunch 
with the Conners Sunday, then 
continued on their way home 
Sunday afternoon. 

Miss Gina Conner accompanied 
her grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Duckworth of Lockney, to 
Dodson to attend a Hunt Family 
Reunion, Mrs. Duckworth's fam-
ily, over the weekend. 

Rev. and Mrs. W. L. Arm-
strong had still not heard from 
their daughter-in law and her 
two children, who had flown to 
Houston just before the storm to 
visit her sister. They were to 
have left for Singapore Tuesday, 
so the Armstrongs are hoping 
that "no news is good news." 
They did not know the last name 
of her sister nor her phone 
number so could not try to 
contact them. 
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Students 
Faculty 

And 
All School Personnel 

We Wish For You 
A 

Pleasant and Rewarding 
school Year 

KATHY'S BEAUTY SHOP 
ELAINE, KATHY 

Shampoo and Set   - 	 88.00 
Hair Cut 	 $6.00 
Perms 	 $25.00 up to $40.00 

WEDNESDAY THROUGH FRIDAY 
Phone 455-1305 



25, IN 

tall dr^ i f,. 
let C ari, 
tan g  st, 

'turned to 

spent the 
 le mod,. 

CaWonu  

I MeFad 

Kaufman 
the home 

 and Mrs, 

tildren, 

dens were 
a vaelioi 

 y attended 

had lunch 

lday, then 

ay
. 
 home 

,mPanied 
and Mrs  

Amkney. to 

nt Family 
rth's fair 

L. Arm 

mrd hen 

'1 flown to 
1( !storm to 

Were  In 

Tuts.--. 

'0 

d news. - 
 last name 

ter phone 
I try  to 

SEMI-ANNUAL SALE 
Other ,:ijefureirg 

In Roaring Springs 

SALE ENDS SATURDAY, AUGUST 27 

Lay Away For Christmas 

50% to 75% Off Retail Price 

14K Yellow Gold Solid Rope Bracelet 

Retail $0000 	On Sale $25.95 

30" Solid Rope Necklace 

Retail $27000 	On Sale $110.00 

14K Yellow Gold Nugget Bracelet 

Retail $1800 	On Sale $7.50 
16" Matching Necklace 

Retail $45 00 	516.50 

1 /4 Ct. Diamond Studs 	Retail $520 00Sale $169.00 
1 /3 Ct. Diamond Drop Retail $64000 Sale $209.00 

19 Diamond .46 C t. Waterfall Ring 
Retail $1,260.00 
	

Sale $420.00 

39 Diamond 1.04 Ct. Dinner Ring 

Retail $3,260.00 	Sale $1,075.00 

31 Brilliant 14 Baguette Dinner Ring 
4.05 Ct. Retail $10,000.00 Sale $3,333.00 

14K Yellow Gold Beads Retail 	Sale. 

Retail Sale 14K Gold Cross 	$50 00 	$12.50 
3mm .80C .25C 14K Gold Hoops 	$44 00 	$11.00 
4mm $1.60 .40c 14K Gold Earrings 	554 00 	$13.50 
5mm $2.40 .70M 

6mm $4.00 $1.10 90 Day Layaway 
7mm 

8mm 

$5 25 

8.00 

$1 . 50 

$2.40 Available 

Come to the source in Fine Jewelry 
In Bustling Metropolitan Roaring Springs 

Open 10 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. Monday Thru Saturday 
Phone Toll Free 1-800-692-4249 or 806-348-3971 

Boyles Reunion 
Held Sunday 
In Quitaque 

The Boyles Family Reunion 
was held Sunday, August 21, at 
the Community Center in Quita-
que. 

Those attending this year 
were Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Hackler 
of Bowie; Mrs. Doris Crump and 
Mrs. Debra Crimp. Plains; Mrs. 
Mary Lee Walters, Mrs. Sandra 
Smith and Trent Silverton 

Bobbe Mayfield. Rusty Mayfield 

and Michelle Curd, Las Vegas. 
Nevada: Kathy and Sheri Austin. 
Laughlin, Nevada; Brenda May 
field, Houston; Jewell Mayfield. 

Sue and Mitzi Ferguson. Lub 
bock. 

Others were Bob, Karon, Bran 
don and Courtney Boyles. Can 
yon; Jana Boyles. Turkey; Steve 
and Teresa Jackson. Abernathy; 
Mrs. Viola Boyles. New Boston; 
Bobbie Maples. Plainview: Mr. 
and Mrs. J. J. McCay, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Boyles and Mrs. 
Andie Kimbell. all of Amarillo: 

Minnie' Mae Roberson. II. G. 

Dories. Mr. and Mrs. Tate Boyles 

and Maynard Wilson, Quitaque. 
A delicious dinner was enjoyed 

by everyone and several took 
pictures during the day. A great 
time was reported by all those 

attending. 

NEW ARRIVAL 

Steve and Jena 'Mullin) Mc  
Claine of Mt. Carmel, Illinois are 
the proud parents of a new baby 
son, who was born August 17. He 
weighed 11 lbs. and was given 
the name of Christopher Kent. 

Mrs. McClaine is a former 
Turkey resident. Her parents. 
Mr. and Mrs. Ottis Mullin, left 
Turkey Saturday morning on 
their way to Illinois for a week's 
visit with the young couple and 
the new grandson. 

Ann and U. F. Coker. jr. 
reported that Kim and his wife 
called them Thursday night and 
said that their fence blew away 
and their roof sustained damage, 
but they felt so lucky in the face 
of all the other damage. 

A group from Quitaque drove 
to Lake Mackenzie Thursday and 
were guests for dinner at the 
lake home of Mr. and Mrs. J. D. 
Nance. Those present were Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Whittington. 

Mrs. Dora Hawkins, Mrs. Ruby 
Cushenberry. NIr. and Mrs. Don 
nie Brunson. Mr. and Mrs. James 
Brunson. Mir. and Mrs. Leroy 
Hamilton. Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Maupin and Amy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Carter and granddaugh 
ter. Melanie. Mrs. Floye McCrac 
ken. Mr. and Mrs. Elgin Conner 
and girls. Amy Payne and Mr. 
and Mrs. Gary Chandler and 
children. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Carter and 
granddaughter, Melanie Carter, 
drove to Canyon Thursday night 
and spent the night with Mrs. 
Larry Hedrick and boys. Larry 
was away on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Shorty Woods 
visited Willie Woods at Lockney 
General Hospital Saturday. They 
drove on to Plainview and visited 
his sister and husband, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lewis Graham. 

Lottie Owens visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Buddy Morris at Lockney 
General Hospital Friday. She 
stopped by to ask about Willie 
Woods, but he was asleep and 
she didn't disturb him. 

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Murry Morrison and Joe 
over the weekend were Mrs. Era 
Heckerson of Dimmitt and her 

sister-in-law, Mrs. Rosa Lee 

Mace of Palm Springs, California. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bryant Eddleman 
of Silverton joined them for 
lunch Sunday. They also visited 
Mrs. Ruby Cushenberry during 
the weekend. 

0 	 
Mr. and Mrs. Wendell Farley 

drove to Amarillo Saturday and 
decorated for their niece's wed-
ding. She is LeAnna Farley and 
she married David Short at the 
San Jacinto Baptist Church. The 
Farleys attended the wedding, 
also. Others present for the 
wedding included Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Farley and son, Steve, 
Mr. and Mrs. Odell Farley, Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Wagner and sons, 

Keith and Timothy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dan Hill and their son and a 
friend, all of Farmington, New 
Mexico; Mr. and Mrs. Dennis 
Farley, Melody and Vance, Quit-
aque; Mr. and Mrs. Larry Farley, 
April and Cory, Amarillo. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Barefield 
accompanied their daughter, 
Frankie Pittman of Wolfforth, to 
Miami Friday and they all spent 
the weekend with their son and 

brother, Phil Barefield and fam-

ily, Lynette, Debra and Mark. 
They returned to their respec-
tive homes Sunday afternoon. 

NEW GRANDDAUGHTER 

FOR THE ALBERT RAMSEYS 

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Dewayne 

Stone of Possum Kingdom are 
the proud parents of a new baby 
daughter, Kristen Amber, born 
Wednesday, August 17, at 8:20 

am. at Lockney General Hospi-
tal. She weighed 8 lbs. 8 ozs. and 
measured 20 inches. 

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Albert Ramsey of 

Quitaque and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Stone of Silverton. 

Great-grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Lois Stone and Mrs. 
Velma Stone, all of Rails. and 
Mrs. Jessie Barnes of Sweetwa-
ter. 

"Sit loose in the saddle of 
fate." 	Francis Yeats Brown 

MRS. E. J. FARI.EY 

HONORED ON IIER 

EIGHTIETH BIRTHDAY 

The family of Mrs. K. J. Farley 
honored her on her 80th birthday 

anniversary Sunday with a din-
ner and a reception following in 
the First National Bank Com-
munity Room. It was also to 
honor her son, Junior, on his 
birthday. 

Those present to enjoy the 
meal and the birthday cake with 
all the trimmings were Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Lingo and Joe, Mrs. 
Pam Van de Grill. Farmington. 
New Mexico; Mr. and Mrs. 0. E. 
Chandler, Quitaque, their daugh-
ter and family, Mrs. Linda 
Dalluge, Charmaine and Keetha, 
Tulia, and another daughter and 
her son. Mrs. Barbara Pigg and 
Jon Earl, Silverton; Mr. and Mrs. 
Wendell Farley. Quitaque, their 
son and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Farley. April and Cory, 
Amarillo, another son and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Farley. 
Melody and Vance and Little 
Miss Jamie Wellman. Quitaque; 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Farley, Aztec, 
New Mexico; Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Farley and Steve, Far-
mington. New Mexico; Mr. and 
Mrs. Odell Farley. Farmington, 
New Mexico and their family, 
Mr. and Mrs. James Farley, 
Robert and Robin, Farmington, 
New Mexico; Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Farley and girls, Patricia and 
Lura, Quitaque; Mr. and Mrs. 
Lester Baugh. Grand Junction, 
Colorado. 

Friends who called during the 
afternoon were Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Grundy, Mrs. Orval 
Cobb, Mrs. Estelle Davidson, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Mayfield, all of 
Quitaque, Freddie Davidson, 
Amarillo, and Terry Green, 
Silverton. 

The family reports an enjoy-
able time together visiting, eat-
ing and reminiscing. 

ENTRIES NEEDED FOR 

MISS HALL, JUNIOR 

MISS PAGEANTS 

The Alpha Pi Lambda Chapter 
of Beta Sigma Phi and the Hall 
County Picnic Association will be 
sponsoring the Miss Hall County 
Pageant and the Junior Miss 
Pageant on Saturday. September 
10. 

All girls in the sixth, seventh 
and eighth grades are invited to 
enter the Junior Miss Pageant. 
Those in the Ninth through the 
twelfth grades are eligible to 
enter the Miss Hall County 
Pageant. 

Any girl in the Hall County 
area is eligible to enter. To enter 
contact Carol Hooper at 259-
3238; Marilyn Lane, 259-2101, or 
Sandra Harrison at 259-2144 for 
an entry form. 

and her 

A living ferret had not been 

seen since 1965 in Wyoming, 
reports National Wildlife maga-
zine. But every since September, 
1981, when Lucille Hogg of 

Meeteetse, Wyoming walked in-
to a local taxidermy shop with a 
dead "mink or something" killed 
by her dog, biologists have been 

sweeping the Wyoming prairie 
with spotlights, looking for the 
unmistakable emerald stare of 
perhaps the rarest mammal in 

North America—the black-footed 
ferret. 

"Patience is bitter, but its 

fruit is sweet.'" 
French Proverb 

Tilt RSD 	ta 51 25, 1953 
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NOTICE OF INTENT TO FILE 
Notice is hereby given by West Texas Utilities 

Company (WTU) that on September 1. 1983, n in-
lends to file troth the pubic Utirty Commission of 
Texas lCommrswon) under Commission Substan-
tive Rule 23 23 (052.02 03 033) (b) (2) — Rate 
Structure a Petition to Set Interim and Final Fuel 
Factors By this filrng, WTU will petition the COMMIS-
NOri to set both intenni and final fuel factors to be 
applicable to all bills rendered by WTU during the 
twelve month period commenong with the Sep-
tember 1963 boiling period Notice is also given that 
on August 15, 1983, WTU filed with the Commission 
the informational Ming required by Rule 23 23 
(052.02 03 033) (b) (2) — Rate Structure 

Upon fihng of the Pelthon. WTU will seek to have 
the proceeding to set final fuel factors consolidated 
for purposes of heanng only with rts pending base 
rate increase request. Commission Dockel No 
5204 The heanng in Docket No 5204 is scheduled 
to commence at 10 00 a m . Tuesday. September 6 
1963. at the Commission s offices, 7800 Shoal 
Creek Boulevard, Suite 400N. Austin, Texas 78757 
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424 
Folks used to wonder what Grandpa Brown and I 

had in common. He most have been close to eighty 
when I was just a kid But I remember him as one of 
the best friends I ever had 

He was a wonderful old man, with a simple, 
native wisdom. We used to go fishing together and 
he would talk to me about God and Faith and Love. I 
remember he said people shouldn't wait until iv4 
they're in trouble before going to Church. "When 
you're happy," he told me. "take time out to offer a 
prayer of thanks " 

The Church had acted as a balance for him 
during good times and a bulwark during bad times. 

Down through the centuries the Church has 
made great Christians out of unassuming people. 
They in turn have transmitted the blessings of the 
Church to oncoming generations. I hope I can bring 
Grandpa Brown's faith and wisdom to others, as I 
was impressed by him 
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CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Turkey, Texas 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings 

SUNDAY: 
Morning Service 	10:30 a.m. 
Evening Service 	 6:00 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY: 
Evening Service 	 8:00 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Turkey, Texas 

Pastor: Melvin Clinton 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings 

SUNDAY: 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	 7:00 p.m. 

MONDAY: 
Women's Missionary 

Society 	  4:00 p.m. 
WEDNESDAY: 

Prayer Meeting 	 8:00 p.m. 

MT. OLIVE BAPTIST CHURCH 

Turkey, Texas 
Pastor: John Boyd of Lorenzo 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings 

Pastoral Days 	1st & 3rd Sundays 

MONDAY: 
Mission 	  4:00 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY: 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:00 p.m. 

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
Turkey, Texas 

Pastor: W. L. Armstrong 
Weekly Schedule of Meetings 

SUNDAY: 
Church School 	 9:55 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	10:55 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	 6:00 p.m. 

MONDAY (First and Third): 
United Methodist 

Women 	  4:00 p.m. 

ST. ELIZABETH ANN SETON 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Turkey, Texas 
Rev. Randy J. Kreher C. M. 

SUNDAY: 
Mass 	 12:00 p.m. 

THE PEOPLE WHOSE NAMES APPEAR BELOW SPONSOR 
THIS MESSAGE WITH THE HOPE OF PROMOTING A 

BETTER CHRISTIAN COMMUNITY. 

Peoples State Bank 

City Drug 
Lacy Dry Goods 

Turkey Automotive 
Seigler Funeral Home 

Peery & Dugan Oil Co. 
Ferguson Insurance 

City of Turkey 

Three Brothers Station 

C & L Food 

Memphis Compress 

Turkey Farmers Coop Gin 
Mullin Motor Company 

• 



ALAN D. ROW, M.D. 
announces the opening of 

his office in 

OPHTHALMOLOGY 
Diseases and Surgery of the Eye 

3813 22nd Street, Suite 5 
Lubbock, Texas 79410 

(806) 797-9550 
By Appointment Onl 

Our Flowers Say It Best 

Shop At 

FARLEY'S FLOWERS 
& VARIETY 

Wendell, Roberta, Johnnie, Debbie 
t!1 IT SQL L. I i 

455-1410 

For All Your Flower & Variety Needs 

BYRD PHARMACY 
Of Lockney 

FRED BYRD 

Prompt Courteous Service 

Call us and we can mail your 

prescription to be refilled. 

IN THE HOSPITAL 
BUILDING 

Maor 
Med

j
ical 

that's 
worth a 
Million. 
Time Insurance 
Company's Major 
Medical plan offers: 

$1,000,000 in lifetime benefits 
per insured party.  

Payment of all covered charges 
both in and out of the hospital 
Without schedules.  

A deductible you pay lust once 
a year rather than with each 
medical occurrence 

And the plan is area-rated so 
you don't pay for higher risk 
areas of the country.  

Call us for full details 

CONNER 
INSURANCE 
Phone 455-1100 
Quitaque, Texas 

TIME INSURANCE COMPANY 

A & B CONSTRUCTION 

ROOFING — REMODELING — REPAIRS 

Electrical Contracting, Free Estimates 
Call Collect: 423-1164 Mike Berry or 

259-2995 Kirk Anderson 

PROCTOR ELECTRONICS 
T.V. - Radio Repair 

Quitaque, Texas 	455-1445 

'ST2s 

Till RSD A l. 	s 25,1983 
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Mrs. Bain Is 
Leader For 
Turkey UMW 

Mrs. Gordon Bain was pro 

grew leader for the Turkey 
United Methodist Women Mon-
day. August M. held in the 
chapel of Turkey United Metho-
dist Church. Topic used was 'To 
Whom Do We Listen. -  and was 
based on the scripture taken 
from James 2:8. Purpose of the 
lesson was "to learn to be 
witnesses of God's love to an 
unloving world." 

MN. John Adamson brought 
the devotional, entitled "Gaining 
an Intimacy with God." which 
was an original article written by 
her friend. Maybell Messner of 
San Francisco. 

Mrs. Gene Fusion. president. 
presided for a business session. 

It was voted to sell paring knives 
to raise money for the organiza-

tion. and to have a rummage sale 
again this year during the month 
of October. on Saturdays only, at 

least for four times. Meeting 
adjourned with prayer. Nine 
ladies were present. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Price 
spent some time in Dallas this 
week at market buying for the 
store. 

FILM ON M Anil AN A 

TO BE SHUN N 

TURKE1 CHI ROI St . NDA1 

The pastor. Res. W L. Arm-
strong. has announced that a film 
on marijuana will be shown at 
the Turkey United Methodist 
Church Sunday evening at 6:00. 
The public is cordially invited to 
see the film. 

Ninth Annual 
Allsup's Marathon 
Is Oct. 1 

The stage is set for the Ninth 
Annual Human Drama that is: 
The Allsup's Marathon! From all 
over the United States, runners 

will gather in the traditionally 
beautiful fall atmosphere of 
Clovis. New Mexico for one of the 

biggest events for runners in the 
Southwest. 

Over 500 runners are expected 

to compete in this year's road-
races to be held October 1, 1983. 

Again, this year there are three 
big events from which runners 
may choose: the full marathon 
126.2 miles), the half marathon 

113.1 miles) and the 10 K 00.000 
meters). All of the races begin 

and end at the same locations tan 
Olympic style finish in the 
stadium) and the running surface 

Is fast. flat asphalt throughout 
the courses. As in the past, the 
courses are all certified to insure 

quality races and accurate times 
for all participants. 

Quality trophies will go to: 
Men—first five overall, and Wo-
men—first three overall, with 

awards in each class for men and 

women. Tee shirts will be 
awarded to all finishers, plus 
commemorative patches for all 
marathon finishers. 

All runners are invited to come 

and run in the Ninth Annual 

Allsup's Marathon. October 1, 
1983 in one of the friendliest 
cities in the Southwest. You may 
register until September 30. 8:00 

p.m. by writing Allsup's Mara-
thon, P.O. Box 1907, Clovis, New 

Mexico 88101 or by calling 1505) 
769-2311. Ex. 724. Registration 
fees are $7.00 prior to September 
24 and $9.00 after September 24. 
All proceeds go to the Clovis 

Roadrunners Club. 

LEITER TO THE EDITOR 

Dear Friend: 
I have strongly and consistent-

ly opposed withholding on inter-

est and dividends since the 
provision became public law last 

summer. Knowing of your inter-
est in legislation to repeal this 
provision, I am pleased to inform 
you that with my support, the 
Congress has passed and the 

President has signed into law the 
repeal measure, thereby putting 

to rest this unfair tax proposal. 
As a result, the Internal 

Revenue Service will not be 
collecting a percentage of the 

taxes owed on your interest and 
dividend income prior to the due 
date of your taxes. However, the 
final measure contains several 

compliance provisions designed 
to facilitate the collection of 
previously unreported dividend 
and interest income. These pro-
visions will enable the IRS to 

identify and collect from tax 
evaders without placing undue 
burdens on law-abiding citizens. 

Your comments and those of 
other citizens were instrumental 

in bringing withholding to the 
attention of the Senate for 
consideration. I hope you will 
continue to keep me apprised of 
your views on issues of mutual 

concern. 

Sincerely, 
Lloyd Bentsen 
United States Senate 

0 

Summer Vacation 
Soon To End 

The summer vacation will soon 
be over and thousands of young-

sters will be starting back to 
school, many of those for the first 
time. Last year in Texas the 
pedestrian fatalities accounted 
for 732 traffic deaths, according 
to Major Vernon Cawthon, Re-
gional Commander of the Texas 
Department of Public Safety. 

He said. "Motorists need to 
slow down as they drive through 
school zones and in and around 
school areas." 

He added. "Those big yellow 
buses will also be back on our 
streets and highways, and Texas 
law requires the driver of a 

vehicle meeting or overtaking a 
school bus displaying red flash-
ing warning lights that is in the 
process of loading or unloading 
passengers to stop until the 
school bus starts moving, the red .  

lights are no longer flashing, or 
the bus driver directs motorist to 
proceed." 

Cawthon said. "It is most 
important that drivers observe 
speed limits in school zones and 
the school bus loading laws for 

the protection of our children, 
because no one wants to be 
responsible for the death or 
injury of a young child." 

Another former Valley student 
who is attending college this fall 

is Tonya (Patterson) Cambridge. 
She has enrolled for two night 
courses at Richland College in 

Dallas. as she is employed full 
time with Marsh and McClendon 
Insurance Agency in downtown 

Dallas. Tonya plans to work 
toward an associate degree in 
business management. She got 
her GED last fall. 

An acre of trees can remove 13 
tons of dust and significant 

amounts of other potentially 
harmful gases every year from 

the surrounding environment, 

says National Wildlife magazine. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Seymour 
spent the weekend in Buffalo 
Gap visiting with their son. Mr. 
and Mrs. David Seymour and 
family. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Setliff 
were scheduled to go back to 
Lubbock on Wednesday of this 
week for George to have more 
tests run. 

How big is the world's largest 
flowering blossom? Would you 
believe each blossom of a raffle 
sia (rah FLEE-zee-uh) flower, 

that grows in the jungles of 
Sumatra and Malaya, may be 

three feet across and weigh up to 
25 pounds, reports National 
Wildlife's Ranger Rick magazine. 
It takes nine months for the 
cabbage-like bud to grow into a 

blossom. 

—0----
Chemicals from certain tropi-

cal plants are now used to treat 

Parkinson's disease, relax mus 
cies and are used in birth control. 
reports International Wildlife 

magazine. 
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NO MATTER HOW IT FALLS 

IT SPELLS 

DISASTER 
To Growing Crops 
It's so easy to obtain 
hail insurance for your 
growing crops at low 
net cost—a dividend 
has been paid to Crop 
Hail Policyholders 
eight of the past 
twelve years, and for 
1983-15% DEVIA-
TION OFF OF TEXAS 
CROP HAIL RATES. 
lust call your Texas 
Farm Bureau In-
tirance Companies 

Agent. 

TOMMY EDWARDS 
Briscoe County 
Farm Bureau 

Quitaque 	455-1129 

IHarth Metal ( 
disk blades... 

get one FREE! 

E 

. ,• 	, ,even Earth Metal Disk 
Braces and We II give you one free. 

This otter conies at a doubly good lime First 
of all it s lust in time for fall disking And. most 
important right now we re offering tillage parts 
at a huge discount— substantially below the 
regular IH suggested list prices 

On lobo! this we Howe you one Tree disk blade 
for every seven you buy of the same part 
number DPI I miss this timely offer of sayings 

top of savings an offer that alSO applies to 
shares held Cultivator sweeps chisel 

eeps. and cn,sei ports Hurry this is a 

• .fed lime offer 

Exclusive IH 
Earth Metal Disk Blades 

are 60° 0 stronger, last 20°o longer. 

1.11.1.1•TION•l1111111111STIII BROWN-McMURTRy 
Implement Company 
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Former Turkey 
Resident Buried 
There Friday 

Chester L. McKay, 54, died at 
1:00 p.m. Wednesday at Caprock 
Hospital in Floydada after a 
lengthly illness. 

Services were held Friday at 
2:00 p.m. at the First Baptist 
Church in Floydada with the 
Rev. Floyd C. Bradley, pastor, 
officiating. Burial was in the 
Turkey Cemetery under the 
direction of Moore-Rose Funeral 
Home of Floydada. 

Mr. McKay, born August 28, 
1928, in Turkey, Texas, moved to 
Floyd County in January 1974 
from Euless. A truck driver, he 
was a veteran of World War II, a 
member of the First Baptist 
Church and the Masonic Lodge. 

He married the former Doro-
thy Kindle January 19, 1949 in 
Matador. 

Survivors are his wife; two 
sons, Calvin McKay of Fort 
Worth and Chris McKay of the 
home; three daughters, Brenda 
Pikkarainen, Renee Beggs and 

' Michelle McKay, all of Floydada; 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. CaHie 
McKay of Turkey; three broth-
ers, Joe, Jerry and Billy McKay, 
all of Amarillo; four sisters, Sybil 
Thomas of Silverton, Nelda Mc-
Dowell of Euless, Rosie Echter-
meyer of California and Geneva 
Huffety of Odessa; and six grand-
children. 

Grady 0. Tyler 
Buried In 
Resthaven Friday 

Grady 0. Tyler, 75, died at his 
home in the Quitaque area 
Tuesday, August 16. 

Services were held Wednes-
day, August 17, at 2:30 p.m. at 
the First Baptist Church. with 
Elgin Conner, minister of the 
Quitaque Church of Christ, offi-
ciating. Burial was in Resthaven 
Cemetery. 

Born July 24, 1908 in Briscoe 
County, he was a veteran of 
World War H having served in 
the Air Corps. He married 
Lavern Epps in 1946 in Silverton, 
Texas. He was a member of the 
Baptist Church. 

Surviving is his wife, of the 
home. 

Pallbearers were John Currie, 
Johnny Peery, Jimmy Davidson 
and Leroy Hamilton. 

Scotty Steward 
Buried In 
Resthaven Sunday 

Berna S. (Scotty) Steward, 70, 
died in Fort Worth. 

Services were held at the B. H. 
Carroll Baptist Church in Fort 
Worth Saturday at 3:00 p.m. 
with the Rev. Charles Bernal 
officiating. 

Graveside rites were held 
Sunday, August 21, at 4:00 p.m., 
with the Rev. Wayne Norman, 
pastor of the First United 
Methodist Church, officiating. 
Interment was in Resthaven 
Cemetery. 

Survivors are his wife, of Fort 
Worth; one son, Wiley Steward; 
two sisters, Helen Horn of Fort 
Worth and Augusta Dennis of 
Lipan; and two grandsons. 

His wife is the former Charity 
Cain of Quitaque. 

SENIOR 4-H'ERS NEED TO 

SIGN UP TO ATTEND 

TECH FOOTBALL GAME 

Senior 4-H members, parents, 
leaders and county officials who 
are interested in attending the 
Texas Tech vs. L.C.U. football 
game November 5, 1983 need to 
contact the Extension Office 
immediately. The phone number 
is 823-2343. 

This event is being sponsored 
by Texas Tech University with 
the College of Home Economics 
and College of Agricultural 
Sciences of Texas Tech Univer-
sity to celebrate the 75th Anni-
versary of Texas 4-H. Tickets for 
the event will cost $5.00 per 
person; this includes cost of 
lunch and football tickets. Bris-
coe County has 30 tickets at this 
time and they will be distributed 
on a first-come, first-served 
basis. 

"The sinner who spends and 
gives away is better than 
the devotee who begs and 
lays by." Sad, 

James (Buster) Taylor, Little-
ton, Colorado City Councilman, 
was elected Vice-President of the 
Colorado Municipal League at 
their 61st Annual Conference in 
June. Taylor has been active in 
Municipal League affairs (policy 
committee, resolutions commit-
tee, legislative committee, high-
way finance committee, nomina-
ting committee, revenue-sharing 
re-enactment committee, and 
chairman of the majors and 
councilmen section) since his 
election to the Littleton City 
Council in 1977 and has been on 
the Executive Board for two 
years. He previously was an 
elected member of the North-
glenn City government from 
1969 to 1975 and was on the 
Executive Board then from 1973 
until he resigned to move to 
Littleton in 1975. 

"It was an unexpected turn of 
events," Taylor said, "although I 
did intend to be a candidate for 
an office, getting elected Vice-
President was a mild surprise." 
There were about 1,000 people in 
attendance at this year's annual 
meeting which was held in 
Colorado Springs. 

During the four-day confer-
ence speeches were given by 
presidential candidate Gary 
Hart, Governor Dick Lamm, 
National League of Cities Presi-
dent Charles Royer, and Evan 
Vlachos, Director of Environ-
mental Resources Center at 
Colorado State University. In 
addition, there were section 
meetings for all city depart-
ments, and workshops on water, 
small communities, innovative 
ideas, municipal/county rela-
tions, energy impact programs, 
community development block 
grants and financial manage-
ment. 

Taylor, a commissioner of the 
Littleton Riverfront Authority, 
presided over an Urban Revital-
ization Workshop. The workshop 
discussed urban renewal author-
ities, downtown development 
authorities, tax increment finan-
cing, creative debt financing for 
public projects, and how to make 
and use an economic develop-
ment plan. 

Besides City Council, Munici 
pal League and Riverfront Auth-
ority, Taylor is a board member 
of Western Welcome Week, Inc.; 
InterFaith Task Force; South-
East Metropolitan Disadvantag-
ed Homemakers Committee; 
treasurer of the Sheridan Com-
munity Library Committee; and 
chairman of the Sick Leave Bank 
Council for Sheridan Schools. He 
is a member of the Friends of the 
Library/Museum; Arapahoe 
County Republican Central Com-
mittee; South Suburban Capital 
Improvements Committee; Col-
orado Department of Elemen-
tary School Principals; National 
Association of Elementary 
School Executives. He is the 
Executive Officer of a Boy Scout 
Troop and one of the head 
supervisors of the South Subur-
ban Ski Club which takes bus-
loads of teenagers skiing each 
winter weekend. 

He will be beginning his 27th 
year in Sheridan School District 
in September and his eleventh as 
an elementary school principal 
and is the director of the .. • 

• 

JAMES [BUSTER] TAYLOR 

English-as-a-Second Language 
program. He and his wife, Ginny, 
have five children ranging in age 
from 11 to 18. 

The Colorado Municipal Lea-
gue is a non-profit, non-parti-
san association organized and 
operated by municipalities to 
provide support services to its 
235 member cities and towns in 
Colorado. 

Taylor is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Dick Taylor of Quitaque. 

TIPS 01■1„,„,.., 
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Booklet Offers Tips 
To Guard Against Theft 

Because their purses are 
generally in plain view, wom-
en suffer seven out of ten 
card thefts, reports a new 
booklet that offers tips to 
travelers to guard against 
thefts 

THURSDAY, AUGUST 25, 1983 

BRISCOE 4-H TO 
SERVE BARBECUE LUNCH 

Briscoe County 4-H will be 
sponsoring a barbecue lunch for 
Ray Patterson and Associates 
Auctioneer Service August 30, 
1983 beginning at 9:00 a.m. The 
lunch will be served during  a 
farm sale which will be held at 
Silverton Gin. The purpose of 
this event is to raise money for 
the Briscoe County 4-H Clubs. 

The concession stand will be 
open from about 9:00 a.m. until 
4:00 p.m. 

9:00-11:00—Coffee, 	Drinks, 
Doughnuts 

11:00- 2:00—Barbecue 	Sand- 
wiches 

2:00- 4:00—Drinks, etc. 

The booklet, called "In-
ternational Travel," also pro-
vides useful travel informa-
tion, such as a list of holi-
days in 35 countries, world 
time and metric conversion. 

Written by Visa Interna-
tional, the booklet cautions 
women not to leave a purse 
unattended under any cir-
cumstances. It says many 
thefts occur when a purse 
is laid aside momentarily in 
a crowded setting, such as a 
restaurant or shopping area. 

A few other tips are 
• Make a list of card num 

hers, including addresses 
and telephone numbers of 
issuers to aid in promptly 
reporting lost or stolen 
cards. 

• Leave unnecessary 
cards at home in  a  secure 
place. 

• Check your cards 
and travellers cheques per-
iodically. 

THE VALLEY TRIBUNE 

Taylor Elected 
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UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

Quitaque, Texas 

Pastor: Wayne Norman 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings 
SUNDAY: 

Church School 	  9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	 6:00 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY: 
Bible Study 	  7:00 p.m. 

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

Flomot, Texas 

Pastor: Wayne Norman 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings 
SUNDAY: 

Morning Worship 	 9:30 a.m. 
Church School 	 10:30 a.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Quitaque, Texas 

Minister: Elgin Conner 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings 
SUNDAY: 

Morning Worship 	10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	 6:00 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY: 
Bible Study 	  7:00 p.m. 

FLOMOT BAPTIST CHURCH 

Flomot, Texas 

Pastor: Melvin Smith 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings 
SUNDAY: 
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Sunday School 	  10:00 a.m. 
Worship Service 	 11:00 a.m. 
Church Training 	 6:30 p.m. 
Worship 	  7:30 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY: 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

Quitaque, Texas 

Pastor: Mike Grebenik 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings 
SUNDAY: 

Sunday School 	  9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 10:45 a.m. 
Training Union 	  5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	 6:30 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY: 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:00 p.m. 

JEHOVAH'S WITNESSES 

First & Jago 

Quitaque, Texas 

Weekly Schedule of Meetings 
SUNDAY: 

Public Bible Lecture 	10:00 a.m. 
Watchtower Study 	11:00 a.m. 

TUESDAY: 
Bible Study 	 

THURSDAY: 
Ministry School 	 
Service Meeting 

IGIQUISTER 
She's young, she's beautiful, but she doesn't believe in 

God. At least, she doesn't think she does. 

Shocked? Lots of young people today and a good many 

older ones aren't all that sure of the "old religion.'' ' They don't 

want a panacea. They want something of substance, a truth to 

live with. 

That's why the Church has risen to meet the challenge. 

There's a new tide in today's church, a reality as old as the 

centuries but as new as the future. 

You owe it to yourself to investigate. Copyroght 1981 08, re, AoVerOseig Service 
PO Box 8024 Charloltesolle, Ihrgm,8 22906 

scriptures selected by 

The American Bible Sanely 

Sunday 	Monday 	Tuesday 	Wednesday 	Thursday 	Friday 	Saturday 
8:00 p.m. 	Joshua 	Judges 	I Kings, 	II Kings 	II Kings 	II Kings 	II Kings 

6:1-20 	15:1-19 	17:14-24 	2:1-18 	4:1-7 	4:38-44 	5:10-27 
8:00 p.m. 

	 9:00 p.m. 

THE PEOPLE WHOSE NAMES APPEAR BELOW SPONSOR 

THIS MESSAGE WITH THE HOPE OF PROMOTING A 

BETTER CHRISTIAN COMMUNITY. 
l ade 

ly 
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et 

Valley Farm Store 

Brunson Supply 
Farley's Flowers 8- Variety 

Rice's Dry Goods 

Valley Translator System 
Farmers Coop Gin 

Gulf Oil Products 
Panhandle Compress 

Petro Energy - Analyx, Inc. 
Kathy's Beauty Shop 

Conner Insurance Agency 
First National Bank 

Hawkins Ins. 8- Furniture 
Caprock Gin Co. 
City of Quitaque 

The Valley Tribune 
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Double Treat 
Bulk or Bag 

I.  
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WHEAT 

CLEANING 
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W 

PRODUCERS - FLOYDADA 
Call Collect 983-2821 

E. E. 

DR. 0. R. McINTOSH 
Optometrist 

South Main Street 	 Phone 9833480 
FLOYDADA, TEXAS 

0  
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BUY, SELL,TRADE on RENT THROUGH THE 

CLASSIFIED 
FOR SALE 

MASONRY 	PRODUCTS, 
Sand, Gravel, Cement, Paints, 
Lumber, Hardware. Let us re-
model your home or business. 
Turn-key contract work. Foger-
son Lumber & Supply, Silverton, 
823-2021. 46-tfc 

SEE US FOR GRUMBACHER 
oil and acrylic paints, Shiva oil 
paints, Grumbacher brushes, in-
cluding Control Plus, Jaye Hous-
ton and Duncan brushes; canvas 
and canvas boards, art books. 
Start your Christmas shopping 
early with us. Special: Canister 
sets and utility items 25% off. 
TWO J's CHINA AND GIFTS, 
Turkey, Texas. 10-2tc 

FOR SALE: KENMORE EL-
ectric stove, almond color, used 
only six months. Excellent condi-
tion. See at Bud Bailey home in 
Quitaque. Call 455-1167. 10-2tc 

CAPROCK HOME CENTER 
now has on hand all building 
lumber. Come in and check with 
us; also, for other supplies you 
need. 8-4tc 

GARAGE SALES 

GARAGE SALE: SATURDAY, 
August 27, at the First United 
Methodist Church parsonage, 
located at First and Wilson 
Streets, beginning at 8:00 a.m. 
and continuing to 5:00 p.m.11-1tp 

FOUR FAMILY GARAGE Sale 
September 9-10-11, also 16-17-18 
at home of Melba House on 8th 
Street, featuring knit scraps, 
ceramics, men's, women's and 

►  children's clothing, bedspreads, 
curtains, lamps and jewelry.11-2c 

THREE-FAMILY GARAGE 
Sale: Clothing, furniture, bed-
spreads, and many other items, 
Friday, August 26 from 1:00 p.m. 
to 5:00 p.m. and Saturday, 
August 27, from 9:00 a.m. to 4:00 
p.m. Located one block north 
First National Bank in Quitaque 
at the Greg Ramsey home. 11-1tc 

PUBLIC NOTICES 1 

AEROBICS! COME JOIN THE 
fun! Starting September 6 on 
Tuesdays and Thursdays, $25.00 
per person. Call Sherri Setliff to 
enroll. Ph. 455-1190 or 455-1431. 

11-2tp 

To Give Away 

TO GIVE AWAY: A FIVE 
months old male white cockapoo 
pup. Has had the shots and a 
collar. Oleta Crump, 423-1239, 
Turkey, Texas. 11-1tp 

RE= 
FOR SALE: MIKE MULLIN 
home in Turkey. Three bedroom 
brick with one car garage, on a 
lot and a half, Call Mike in Hobbs, 
New Mexico at 505-397-6016. 

HOME FOR SALE: THREE 
bedroom, 11/4 bath, double gar-
age, steel siding, 2140 total sq. ft. 
Dr. Wayne Maxwell, 423-1492, 
Turkey. 52-tic 

HOME FOR SALE: THREE 
bedroom, 2 baths, den with 
fireplace, carpeted, 3 lots. Mike 
House, 423-1112, Turkey. 38-tic 

SERVICES 

GERMANIA FARM MUTUAL 
Aid Association: Reasonable, 
sound property insurance. If you 
want to save, contact Mrs. 
Orville Lee, Flomot. Call 806-469• 
5370. 23-tic 

HEADS & HEELS: Pickup sta-
tion for laundry and dry cleaning. 
Thursday pickup and delivery for 
Tulia Steam Laundry. Call 455-
1292 for information. 28-tic 

UNDERGROUND PLASTIC lit- 
igation Water and Gas Pipe 
Installed. Backhoe Service, Irri- 
gation Leaks and Repairs. 823- 
2431, Silverton Metal Works. 

44-t1c 

WE ARE A DEALER FOR 
Sanitas Wallpaper. Prompt de-
livery. Sample books available. 
Fogerson Lumber & Supply, 
Silverton, Phone 823-2021. 29-tfc 

LOCKNEY MEAT CO. USDA 
Inspected. Kill days Monday 
through Friday. Custom proces- 
sing. Wholesale and Retail 
Meats. Halves and Quarters Cut, 
Wrapped, Frozen and Fully 
Guaranteed. Sam & Kelly For- 
tenberry, owners and managers. 
Phone 652.3305, corner of U. S. 
70 and Farm Road 378 South. 

15-tic 

LOCKSMITH: REPAIR ON all 
types locks, safe sales and repair. 
Dead Bolts Installed. Pro-Lock 
Shop. Located 15 miles south of 
Riverton, Ph. 983-3834. 9-tic 

THE QUITAQUE POST Office 
is trying to identify interested 
bidders for • cleaning service 
contract. If interested, contact 
Jarrell Rice, Postmaster, Quite-
que, Texas. 11-1tc 

SINGER SEWING MACHINES, 
Vacuum Cleaners, Smith Corona 
Typewriters, Adding Machines, 
Kirby Sales and Service. Buy 
here, service here. Call in 
Quitaque, 455-1101, or call 423- 
1155 in Turkey. Call 259-2716 in 
Memphis. Office located at 620 
Noel in Memphis. Here every 
two weeks oo Thursdays. 28-tic 

EARN EXCELLENT PART 
time income delivering the Am-
arillo Daily News mornings in 
Quitaque. Call Hooper Phillips 
collect 806-376-4488. 10-2tc 

REPAIR WORK: Appliances, 
lawnmowers, etc. Call Berton 
Hughes, 823-2389, Silverton. 

11-3tp 

Senator 

Bill Sarpalius 
Reports 

AUSTIN — Two years 
ago, a commission was 
created by the Department 
of Education to study the 
quality of education in 
America. In its recently 
published 	report, 	"A 
Nation At Risk," the 
National Commission on 
Excellence in Education has 
identified many problems 
affecting public education 
across the nation. 

The Commission found 
that approximately 13% of 
all 17 year olds in the 
United States can be 
considered 	functionally 
illiterate. 	The average 
achievement scores of high 
school students  on  standard-
ized tests are lower now 
than 26 years ago. There 
has been  a  continual decline 
in Scholastic Aptitude Test 
scores from 1963 to 1980. 
The average SAT verbal 
scores have dropped an 
alarming SO points, while 
average mathematics scores 
have fallen nearly 40 points. 

While these deficiencies 
might accurately reflect 
national trends, Texas is on 
the move to significantly 
counter mediocrity in 
public education. In its 
answer to "A Nation At 
Risk," the State Board of 
Education has stressed that 
it has already implemented 
many changes designed to 
improve the quality of 
education in Texas. Texas 
is well ahead of most other 
states in accepting the 
recommendations of the 
Commission. 

In recent years the State 
Board, with the approval 
of the legislature, has 
instituted changes such as 
curriculum reform and 
improvement in teaching 
and the teaching profession. 
Although there has been 
much progress in improving 
the quality of education in 
Texas, we recognize that 
there is still much work to 
be done. We must reaffirm 
our commitment to provide 
quality educational oppor-
tunity for all children. 

Recognizing this need to 
0000000.0000000000000.0 
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ensure quality education in 
Texas, a Select Committee 
on Public Education was 
recently created to study 
various educational issues in 
the state such as teacher 
salaries, educational fund-
ing, and merit pay for 
teachers. The Committee is 
currently conducting public 
hearings throughout the 
state before making its 
recommendations. 

Certainly the most contro-
versial issue under study by 
the Committee involves the 
concepts of teacher salaries 
and merit pay. Many 
education experts contend 
that experienced educators 
are leaving the teaching 
profession at an alarming 
rate, largely because of an 
inadequate salary schedule 
that is unable to compete 
with the private sector. 
They add that unless we 
significantly increase 
teacher salaries, we will be 
unable to attract an 
acceptable number of 
qualified students into the 
teaching profession, and will 
eventually suffer from a 
critical shortage of teachers. 

Opponents of across-the-
board pay raises complain 
that higher salaries will not 
guarantee a higher  quality 
of education. They support 
a  merit pay system whereby 
teachers  are  rewarded 
according to their job 
performance. Opponents of 
merit pay systems counter 
that such systems are 
unworkable because any 
assessment 	of 	job 
performance 	is 	too 
subjective. These 'oppo-
nents add that such systems 
do nothing to address the 
problems of attracting more 
teachers into the profession. 
One suggestion would 
combine the principles of 
both sides by approving an 
across-the-board raise for 

all teachers, along with a 
merit pay system that 
includes administrative and 
teacher assessment of job 
performance. Regardless, 
it is certain that something 
must be done to ensure the 
quality of education for the 
future children of Texas. 

We want to know what 
you feel about this. If you 
have any comments  or 
questions about public 
education in Texas or any 
other items, please let  us 
know by writing Senator 
Bill Sarpalius, P.O. Box 
12068, Austin, Texas, 
78711. 

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Clay of 
Hereford spent Friday in Quita-
que and Turkey visiting relatives 
including their parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Odis Reagan and Mary 
Helen Wallace. 

When they returned home, 
they took four girls with them for 
a visit. They were Chastity and 
Crystal Price, Dee Dee Harmon 
and Doneta Wallace. Mr. and 
Mrs. Odis Reagan drove to 
Hereford and spent Sunday and 
brought Chastity, Crystal and 
Dee Dee home. Donets remained 
and her mother drove up Monday 
and visited and brought her 
home. 

Abalone steak, the popular 
seafood dish found along 
the Pacific Coast and in 
Japan, comes from the mus 
cular foot of the snail. 

Ira 
In the Middle Ages, peo- 
ple thought your intelli- 
gence was in your heart. 
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