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Baird ISD June, July Office Hours Commissioners Court Minutes Immunization Clinics 
The Baird ISD office hours 

for the months of June and 
July are Monday through 
Thursday 7:30 a.m. to 3:30 

* * * * * * * * * * p.m. with ? hour for lunch 
and off on Friday. 

Lana Walls 
Business Manager 

Baird [SD 

Callahan County 
Commissioners Court 

Callahan 	County 
Commissioners' Court 

Notice of Open Meeting 
Date of Meeting: June 

5, 2009, 9:30 A.M. 
Location: 100 West 4th, 

Suite 200 
Callahan County 

Courthouse 
Baird, Texas 79504 
Complete Agenda: 
Call to Order - 

Deliberate and Consider 
Action on the following 
items: 

I. Review and Sign Minutes 
of Previous Meetings 

IL Public Comment 
(5min. per speaker) No 
Discussion or Action 

III. Discuss — Consider 
Disaster Work 

Wednesday, June 10th 
Clyde 	First 	Baptist 

Church 
216 Austin 
Time: 10-12 & 1:30-3:00 
Please bring child's 
Immunization Records 
If child has Medicaid or 

CHIP, please bring card 
For more information call 

325/754-4945 

Texas Department of State 
Health Services 

Immunization Clinics in 
Callahan County 

Monday, June 8th 
Baird Cafetorium 
400 W. 7th 
Time: 10-12 
Cross Plains Housing 
Authority 
233 N. Main 
Time: 2-4 

Commissioner Kirkham 
made a motion to sign an 
Interlocal Agreement with 
the City of Baird concern-
ing the maintenance of the 
City's Landfill Road which 
goes to the 4-I-I Shooting 
Sports Range. Commis-
sioner Windham seconded 
the motion. The motion 
carried 5-0. First Baptist VBS 

Set For June 15-19 

the Unincorporated Area of 
County 

V. Discuss- Consider 
E.M.S. Healthcare Trans-
portation Services Con-
tract- E.M.S. and Callahan 
County 

VI, 	Discuss — Consider 
— Meet with 
Auditors 

VII. Review and Pay 
Approved Bills 
Adjourn 

Pursuant to the authority 
granted under Government 
Code, Chap. 551, the 
Commissioner's Court may 
convene a closed session 
to discuss any of the above 
agenda items. Immediately 
before any closed session, the 
specific section or sections 
of Government Code, Chap. 
551 which provides statutory 
authority will be announced. 

* ** * * ** * * * 

At 10:00 A.M. bids were 
opened for the work to be 
done on the road and drain-
age restoration. Commis-
sioner Hicks made a motion 
to allow Engineer Tabor 
to review bids and to meet 
June 5th to award the bid. 
Commissioner Kirkham 
seconded the motion which 
then carried 5-0. 

* * * * *** * * * 

Bids (Accept or Reject) 
Recommendations Engineer 
Johnny Tabor 

IV. Discuss- Consider Reg-
ulating Certain Fireworks in 

Cross Plains Barbarian 
Festival Set June 13 

personal relationship with 
us. Throughout the week, 
kidaroos will stay on a sin-
gle track of study as they 
learn about the life of Peter 
and how he came to know 
Jesus. No matter where we 
find ourselves in our own 
journey with Jesus, we will 
learn that "It All Comes 
Back to Jesus!" 

Parents are encouraged to. 
preregister their kids now, 
but can be enrolled when 
Vacation Bible School be-
gins. You can pick up a reg-
istration form at First Bap-
tist Church 240 Race St., 
Baird during regular office 
hours 8:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 
Monday through Thursday. 

All kids in the community 
are invited, and transporta-
tion will be provided during 
VBS. Call 325-854-1574 
for pickup information. 

Join First Baptist Church 
in Baird as they take a train 
trip of a lifetime across the 
great Australian Outback 
on the Boomerang Express. 
The Boomerang Express 
will trek out on Monday, 
June 15 through 19 from 6 
to 8:45 p.m. each evening. 
The VBS is open for all 
kidaroos age 3 to completed 
6th grade. 

Every evening kidaroos 
will experience an excit-
ing worship rally, engaging 
Bible and mission study, 
intriguing Aussie crafts, 
jump'n music, fun recre-
ation and yummy snacks 
from the G'Day Cafe. 

As we get a glimpse of the 
amazing scenery and unique 
country of Australia, we 
will also discover the amaz-
ing truth that Jesus Christ 
desires to have a unique and 

Just a few days until this 
year's Barbarian Festival in 
Cross Plains on Saturday, 
June 13th. The festivities 
start at 9 a.m. 

Bring the kids and enjoy 
games, pony rides, an exotic 
petting zoo, duck pond, 
and lots more- even those 
inflatable bouncing houses 
the kids love to jump in and 
on. 

Stroll through craft booths, 
antiques and collectibles, 
as well as, purses, candles, 
woodcrafts, birdhouses and 
other decorative items. Enjoy 
barbeque, turkey legs, funnel 
cakes, ice cream and other 
tasty treats. 

If you haven't turned in your 
registration fomr, but want 
to be apart of the Barbarian 
Festival, you still have a day 
or two- until Monday, June 
8th. Hurry. Call Gaye at 254-
725-4961 to reserve .a booth 
for your group business! 
Booth space starts at only 
$35.00. 

Public Invited To Attend 
Cottonwood Festival June 19 

Break — 10:16 A. M. 
Resume .— 10:33 A.M. 

********** 

Judge Corn made a mo-
tion to sign a Proclamation 
proclaiming that the 2010 
Census is a top priority for 
all elected and appointed 
officials, and encourage full 
support and participation of 
this community in achieving 
an accurate and complete 
count through the formula-
tion of a Complete Count 
Committee. Commissioner 
Farmer seconded the motion 
and the motion carried 5-0. 

********** 

Commissioner Windham 
made a motion to allow the 
Callahan County Museum 
to open Saturday, June 28, 
2009 during Baird Market 
Daze. Judge Corn seconded 
the motion. The motion car-
ried 5-0. 

COMMISSIONERS' 
COURT MINUTES 

1100 W. 4th St. 
Baird, Texas 79504 
May 28, 2009 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

COUNTY OF CALLA-
HAN COUNTY 

The Meeting of the Com-
missioners' Court was held 
at its regular meeting place 
in the Courthouse on May 
28, 2009 A.D., with the 
following officers present 
to wit: 

Roger Corn, Judge Pre-
siding 

Harold Hicks, Commis-
sioner Precinct No. 1 

Bryan Farmer, Commis-
sioner Precinct No. 2 

Tom Windham, Commis-
sioner Precinct No. 3 

Cliff Kirkham, Commis-
sioner Precinct No. 4 

Dianne Gunter, County 
Treasurer 

Donna Bell, County Clerk, 
and ex-Officio Clerk of the 
Commissioners' Court and 
the following items of busi- 
ness were transacted: 

********** 

The meeting was called to 
order at 9:44 A.M. by Judge 
Corn. All were present. 

********** 

The minutes of the previ-
ous meeting were reviewed 
and signed. 

********** 

Under Public Comments 
— None 

Choose your favorites in 
the Talent Contest, as talent 
contest performers take the 
state at 10:00 a.m. and 1:30 
p.m. 

Take a look at the antique 
automobiles, classic cars, 
fine rides, hot rods, street 
rods, and trucks in the 
Antique & Classic Car & 
Truck Show. 

Browse through old 
John Deeres, Farmalls, 
Internationals, Minneapolis 
Molines and other antique 
tractors in the Antique 
Tractor Show. 

Take a chance on any of 
the many prizes that benefit 
the Terry Jane McWilliams 
Wyatt Scholarship Fund. 
Stop by Texas Heritage 
Bank in Cross Plains now 
to see the display of prizes 
and gift certificates and 
then purchase your tickets 
at the festival. Each ticket 
entitles you to a vote in the 
"People's Choice" category 
for the Talent Show, Antique 
& Classic Car & Truck Show 
and Antique Tractor Show. 

Winners of the Talent 
Contest, Antique & Classic 
Car & Truck Show and the 
Antique Tractor Show will 
be announced from the stage 
at 4 p.m. 

Community Center, which 
was once the community's 
schoolhouse, is under the 
care of the Cottonwood 
Historical 	Association, 
which also oversees the 
old Post Office, Methodist 
Church and two cemeteries. 
The building is located on 
CR 446, off of FM 880 in 
Cottonwood, 5 miles North 
of Cross Plains. 

If you would like to help 
with the benefit, either by 
donating or helping serve, 
please contact Beverly 
Brown at 254-725-7369 or 
Dena Nickerson at 254-725-
6377. 

Come out to Cottonwood 
on Friday, June 19th for 
an Olde Time Musical and 
Benefit Spaghetti Supper, 
the proceeds of which 
will go towards repair 
and maintenance at the 
Cottonwood Community 
Center. 

The Spaghetti Supper 
starts at 5 p.m. with the 
music following at 6:30. 
Hear Olde Time Country 
Music performed by 
musicians from the old 
Cottonwood Musicals and 
some musicians that are 
new to Cottonwood. 

The Cottonwood 

*** * * *** * * 

Commissioner Kirkham 
made a motion to sign an 
Interlocal Participation 
Agreement for a Project 
to Develop Standards and 
Requirements for a Com-
mon Integrated Justice Sys-
tem Software Solution for 
County Government with 
the County Information 
Resources Agency and to 
contribute $2,981.11 as its 
share of the cost of the Proj-
ect. Commissioner Farmer 
seconded the motion. The 
motion carried 5-0. 

* * * * * * * * * 

Baird Man Dies 
In 1-20 Rollover 

** * * *** * * * 

Judge Corn made a mo-
tion to pass a Resolution 
commemorating the 85th 
anniversary of the historic 
Bankhead National High-
way. Commissioner Wind-
ham seconded the motion 
which carried 5-0. There 
will be a Dedication Cer-
emony on the Callahan 
County Courthouse grounds 
at noon on Saturday, June 
27, 2009. The public is 
invited. 

Commissioner Farmer 
made a motion to pay the ap-
proved bills. Commissioner 
Kirkham seconded the mo- 
tion which then passed 5-0 

********** 

Commissioner Hicks made 
a motion to adjourn, sec- 
onded by Commissioner 
Windham and carried 5-0. 

********** 

Roger Corn County 
Judge 

The foregoing minutes 
were read and approved this 
	day of 	  
2009 

Donna Bell County Clerk 
Also attending: 
Johnny Tabor / Tabor En-

gineering 
Chris Bristow / RAY-

DON 
Rob Keith / Baker Bridge, 

L.P. 
Kenneth Baker / Baker 

Bridge, L.P. 

A Baird man, identified as 
Billie Wayne Petitt, 41, died 
in a rollover that occurred 
last Friday around 10:30 
a.m. The man was driving 
his Lincoln Town Car west 
on Interstate 20 that hit a 
guardrail and rolled down 
two embankments it was 
reported. He was apparently 
attempting to exit 1-20 onto 
East Highway 80 when the 
right side of his car left the 
roadway. 

He attemtped to move left, 
back onto the exit overpass, 
but he overcorrected, 
according to Abilene 
Police investigators. The 
car went over the top of a 
guard rail and rolled down 
two embankments before 
landing on the shoulder of 
the eastbound 1-20 lanes of 
traffic below. It was reported 

Callahan County 
Star Deadlines 

Tuesday by 
5:00 p.m. 

that Petitt was ejected from 
the car and was not wearing 
a seat belt. 

Medics on the scene 
thought Petitt's injuries were 
not life-threatening, but he 
later died from head injuries 
after being transported to 
Hendrick Medical Center. 

According to police 
investigators, alcohol was 
believed to be a factor in the 
crash, and speed might also 
have contributed. There was 
reported to be a strong odor 
of alcohol around Petitt and 
his car. 

Services for Billy Petitt 
were scheduled for 4 p.m. 
Wednesday, June 3, 2009 at 
the First United Methodist 
Church in Baird. Burial was 
to follow in Ross Cerrietery, 
Spencer-Price 	Addition. 
Services directed by Parker 
Funeral Home of Baird. 

PPS Report 
5-24-09 to 5-30-09 

CASES INVESTIGAT- 
tIL 

Warnings- 96 
Complaints- 53 
DWI- 1 
Driving_ While License In- 

valid-2 
ACCIDENTS  
There were 4 accidents in- 

vestigated during this time 
span. 
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PATHOS 	HUMOR 	HISTORY 	CREATIVE NON-FICTION 	  

CALLAHAN COUNTY 

STAR SPOTLIGHT 
WRITERS SHOWCASE 

(All submitters retain ownership) 

Texas Cactus Photo by Patrick Ready 

Submissions sought 
to: 

Star 
P.O. Box 29 

Eastland, TX 
76448 

email: the bairdspotlight@ 
att.net 

S.A.S.E, for returns 

--WANTED-- 
20 lines, 

double spaced or less 

Poetry 

Fiction or Non 

Each entry with brief 
biography notes. All 
must be family orient-
ed; no smut, slander or 
liable material. 

American Life In Poetry 
Column 219 
BY TED KOOSER, U.S. POET LAUREATE, 2004-2006 
As we all know, getting older isn't hard to do. Time continues 

on. In this poem, Deborah Warren of Massachusetts asks us to 
think about the life lived between our past and present selves, 
as indicated in the marginal comments of an old book. Theme's 
something beautiful about books allowing us to talk to who we 
once were, and this poem captures this beauty. 

Marginalia 
Finding an old book on a basement shelf-- 
gray, spine bent--and reading it again, 

I met my former, unfamiliar, self, 
some of her notes and scrawls so alien 

that, though I tried, I couldn't get (behind 
this gloss or that) back to the time she wrote 
to guess what experiences she had in mind, 
the living context of some scribbled note; 

or see the girl beneath the purple ink 
who chose this phrase or that to underline, 

the mood, the boy, that lay behind her thinking-- 
but they were thoughts I recognized as mine; 

Poetry Media Service 
THE ORIGI NA L CON FES-

SIONAL (ALMOST) TELLS 
ALL 

An interview with W.D. 
Snodgrass. 

By Hilary Holladay 
Poetry Media Services 
Hilary Holladay: I want to 

play a little word association 
With you. I'll say a word or a 
name, and you free-associate 
at will. "Confessional poetry." 

:WD. Snodgrass: Well, it's 
a term I dislike intensely, be-
cause I don't think I was do-
in_g anything very different 
from what poets have done for 
years and years and years. One 
of .the major influences that 
took me toward writing poems 
about losing, I thought, my 
daughter surely was Mahler's 
1Gridertotenlieder 'with lyrics 
from the poems of 19th-cen-
tar)? German poet Friedrich 
Ruckert]. As a matter of fact, 
all the German poets of that 
era, even if they'd never been 
married or had a child, wrote 
poems about the death of their 
children; they would make up 
a child to lose. It became the 
symbolic center of loss, and 
losses that might have been of 
all- sorts but were often com-
pacted into that image. 

When I went into psycho-
therapy in Iowa, the doctors 
there were also very influential 
M saying, "You're not writing 
about what you're interested 
in." I was writing things that 
had some religious overtones. 
[wanted nothing to do with re- 
ligion. and I just put it in the 
poem because that's the sort of 
thing, that the models we were 
given at [the University of 
fp wal would have had. If there 
was a. tiger lily. then surely that 
had to do with Christ. 

HH: So it was confessional. 
in a sense. You were confess-
ing to your therapist. 

WDS: Yes. but that didn't 
affect the poems. M.L. Rosen- 
thal came up with that term 
'Confessional poetry'—he was 
a friend—but I hated it be- 

cause it suggested either that 
you were writing something 
religious and were confess-
ing something of that sort, or 
that you were writing bedroom 
memoirs, and I wasn't doing 
that, either. 

HH: And yet the label stuck, 
and it gave scholars and stu-
dents a way to categorize you 
and Robert Lowell and Anne 
Sexton and Sylvia Plath and a 
few others, and so— 

WDS: I don't think it really 
applies to what I was doing. 
And you'll pardon me for say-
ing so, but I was [writing per-
sonal poems] first. And Lowell 
hated it at first. He said, "Snod-
grass, you have a brain. You 
can't write this kind of tear-
jerking stuff!" It was all part 
of a kind of snobbery in the 
academic world. You weren't 
supposed to have love rela-
tionships or anything of that 
sort. You were supposed to be 
some kind of priest. I decided 
[writing personal poems] is 
probably wrong, but it's what 
I have to do right now. I don't 
like the fact that then that can 
be made into an argument for 
the writing of poetry as a form 
of therapy. It may not be any-
thing of the sort. I don't know 
that it served that purpose. It 
was just where my feelings lay 
right then. 

HH: You influenced [Rob-
ert Lowell'. Did he influence 
you? 

WDS: Early on, yes. 1 had 
to quit reading him altogeth-
er for many years because I 
didn't want to get back under 
that influence again. He wrote 
to me and said he was taking 
those poems of mine [from 
Heart's Needle] as a model, 
and it just scared the hell out 
of me! I thought. "Holy God! 
Here I'm doing something that 
even I think may be a stupid 
mistake." In the meantime. 
he caught hell from his teach- 
ers the same way I caught hell 
from him. He went and read  

some of his more personal po-
ems to Allen Tate, who gave 
him exactly the same kind of 
hell. 

I should say that one other 
thing that moved me in the di-
rection of the personal poems 
was that I became interested in 
music again after a while. For 
as much as 15 years there, I 
stayed clear away from music. 
One day I turned on the radio 
and there was a tenor, Hugues 
Cuenod. One of his first records 
that came out in this country 
was a collection of songs from 
16th- and 17th-centurY Spain 
and Italy. I listened to this re-
cording, and my hair simply 
stood on end. I listened to him 
and thought, `Jesus Christ! My 
poems have got everything ex-
cept that kind of passion and 
that kind of straightforward 
head-on-ness." 

These two musical influenc-
es, that and the Kindertotenli-
eder—both moved me in [the 
more personal' direction, as 
did Jarrell's criticism, although 
he didn't suggest positively that 
I should be writing about my 
personal concerns. My doctor 
supplied that! 

HH: Let me wrap up by ask-
ing you about your name. You 
use your name, Snodgrass, in  

a number of your poems, and 
you told me that the pseudonym 
you've used occasionally, S.S. 
Gardons, is "Snodgrass spelled 
sideways." Why do that? Why 
put your name in your poems? 

WDS: Well, why not? It's 
one of the things that's on your 
mind all the time. Of course, 
as a child I got kidded about 
it all the time, and everybody 
makes up brilliant parodies of 
it which are so obvious that I 
don't think I need to go into 
that. In a certain sense, you're 
alWays writing about yourself. 
Although you may not write 
so directly about yourself and 
the quality of your mind, that's 
ultimately what you're writing 
about, always. 

Hilary Holladay is a professor 
of English at the University of 
Massachusetts, Lowell, where 
she teaches African Ameri-
can literature, literature of the 
Beat movement, and modern 
poetry. This article originally 
appeared on www.poetryfoun-
dation.org. Distributed by the 
Poetry Foundation. Read more 
about W.D Snodgrass, and his 
poetry, at www.poetryfounda-
tion.org 

© 2009 by Hilary Holladay. 
All rights reserved. 

and though there were words I couldn't even read, 
blobs and cross-outs; and though not a jot 
remained of her old existence--I agreed 

with the young annotator's every thought: 

A clever girl. So what would she see fit 
to comment on--and what would she have to say 

about the years that she and I have written 
since--before we put the book away? 

American Life in Poetry is made possible by The Poetry 
Foundation (::•\\ 	)1W(LIT 	1 0, publisher of Poetry 
magazine. It is also supported by the Department of English at 
the University of Nebraska-Lincoln. Poem copyright (c)2008 by 
Deborah Warren, whose most recent book of poems is "Dream 
with Flowers and Boivl'of Fruit,'UniVersity of Evansville PreSi, 
2008. Poem reprinted from the "Hudson Review:' Vol. LXI, 
no. 3, Autumn 2008, and reprinted by permission of the author 
and publisher. Introduction copyright (c)2009 by The Poetry 
Foundation. The introduction's author, Ted Kooser, served as 
United States Poet Laureate Consultant in Poetry to the Library 
of Congress from 2004-2006. We do not accept unsolicited 
manuscripts. 

****************************** 

Rhymes For Today: 
Metamorphosis 

Verdigris 

Remiss 

Bliss 

Miss 

Benefice 

Analysis 

Writers Arid Poets! 
The Eastland/Callahan County Newspapers an-
nounce that the Baird Star will be publishing sub-
mitted poetry and short stories. We will also be 
publishing a literary journal in the near future. 

1. We ask for first-time publishing rights. All 
other rights will remain with the author. 

2. There will be no payment, but you will get 
your works before the general public. We 

will 
be sending sample copies to other organiz-
tions, the literary world and libraries for their 
archives and your notoriety. 

3. Short stories should be brief. Poetry should 
be no longer than 24 lines. 

4. Each submission should be typewritten, single 
spaced, with author's name and contact infor-

mation in the top right hand corner. You must 
include a SASE for the return of the submis-
sion. 

5. Please address all submissions to: 

Literary Editor 
Eastland/Callahan County 

Newspapers 
P. 0. Box 29 

Eastland, TX 76448 
email: thebairdIspotlightgliPatt.net 

Words You Can Use: 
Ennea-eteric: If something happens every ninth 

year, then this adjective can describe it. Remember 
this for the right time to use it. 

Spandrel: A word this is that denotes the corner 
design of stamps , particularly postage. 

Testamur: When you pass your university 
examinations, you might get this, a certificate of 
the accomplishment. 

..Ubiquity: When something is everywhere, this 
word can describe it. Some politician's names are 
like this. It would be interesting to know if there is 
a word for "being somewhere." 

More Than A Feeling 
The headlines list each contribution 

Portraying the donors name and face 
Portraying wealth as the solution 
For all the ills of this human race. 

Many there be who give of their time 
And give of their love for many years 
They're unrecognized and it's a crime 

That pits this Earth with the saddest tears. 

Go store up bags of sweet compassion 
Go plant your rows of concern 

And opt to change the mood and fashion 
By profession care with every turn. 

Tunefully then we whistle along 
Laughing, lifting up those unadorned 

Streamlining fashion with our love songs 
And by showing love should be performed. 

For love is more than just a feeling 
Much more than hoping that all is well 

It's value is shown in believing 
That proving our love will never fail. 

- Weldon L. Smith 
Eastland, Texas 
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9 a.m - 4 p.m. 	'F44416,-- 
Food,. Fun, Crafts, Live Mu is *ids: 
Games, Exotic Petting Zoo, Pony Rides 

Inflatable Bouncers 
NASCAR Racing 
Track, Antique & 

Classic Car & Trucks.. 
Antique Tractors, Collectibles 
Candles 	and lots more!!!! 

& fr,P=i; loo 	 8th ecyCle Blessi 
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4> 	AT 1 P.M. 

	

a celebration of the 	Yourf• 	 by
of Texas 
the - 

life of Robert E. Howard, 9 ift0 Heart Hea  
creator of `Conan the Barbarian' 	 Hot Sun Riders, 

SPAMOVL Ozark Leather 	
part of the Christian 

7-Eleven 	- v 	 Palace Drug 	 Motorcycle Assn 
AAA Stowaway Storage 	Pancakes Flom Stitchin' 
Anything for Everyone 	Parts Plus Cross Plains 
Barr Fabrication 	 Reed Contruction/Box R 
Bear Branch Ranch 	Outfitters 
Caddo Peak Ranch 	Rocky Oaks Ranch 
Callahan Furniture 	Snippits 
Childress Farm 	 Subway. 
City of Cross Plains 	Taste of Texas 
Complete Home Maintenance Texas Hentage Bank 
Cross Plains EDC 	Texas Heritage 
Cross Plains Frozen Foods 	Insurance Agency 
Cross Plains Review 	The Park Car Wash 
Cunningham Ranch 	The Robert E. Howard 
Dairy Queen 	 Foundation 
Dr. Charles Rodenberger 	The Wagon Roadside 
ExtremeWhitetails.net 	Cafe 
Hardwick's Farmer's Market Turner Landscaping 1.‘ 
HigginbOthams 
Higginbotham Funeral 'Home 	Spaii4e,ta, 
J & L Sales 	 Connie's Cuts & Curls 
J & S Ag Fabrication/Boss Hawg Coyote Flats 
Jerry & Chris Biggerstaff 	Dale Mitchell Building 
Kimmy's Rustic to Rhinestones Johnson Dry Gads 
Liveoak Land & Real Estate Lawrence Farm & Ranch 
Main Sheet Pool House & . T&K Tire 

- 	Surf Shop 	- - 	Tim's Floral & Gift§ 
.1DetaiiS -wane at Barbarianrestival.net 

.. 

Class. of '57 performs 
Rock & Roll, County 

. & a variety of music 

Free 800-606-9860 
&pyx 

MEDICAL SUPPLY 
vww.medcaremedicalsupply con) 

FRONTIER BOOT 
& SHOE SERVICE 

Quality Repair Work 
Resonable Prices . 

• All' Type Boot 
&,Shoe Repair 
• Saddle Repair 

• Custom Made Leatherwork 

122 W. Central Comanche 

325-356-3983 5-57  

gc1)1) To3ek ctUokk 

Paul W. Lewallen 
George Willoughby 

254-631-8605 
5.4 	• (mobile) 

106 W. Commerce 
Eastland, TX 76448 
254-629-8896 
Fax 254-629-1426 

Avi T. Deshmukh, M.D., F.A.C.S. 
Board Certified in Urology 

Frank V. Terrell, M.D. 
General Ophthalmology & Ophthalmic Surgery 

Eastland Memorial Hospital 
For Appointment Call 

(254) 629-2601 

CUSTOM HOME BUILDERS 
SINCE 1980 

Let Us Build Your New Home 
or Room Addition 

If You Can Dream It, We Can Build It! 

at J. CLARK CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 
(254) 734-2755 

P. 0. Box 176 111 E. Roberts St. 

Gorman, TX 76454 

General Building Contractors - All Work GUaranteed - 
Custom Homes - Remodeling - Commercial - Industrial - Farm" 

Financing.- Free Estimates - Design; Engineering & Plan Services 

Callahan County Baird Star 

SIGN UP FOR A 
FREE SCOOTER 

One Scooter Given Away Each Month 
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• Callahan County Star, 
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BAIRD- Billy Wayne 
Petitt, 41, of Baird, Texas 
died Friday, May 29, 2009 
in an Abilene hospital. 	. 

Services were held at 4 
p:m. Wednesday, June 3, 
2009 at . the First United 
Methodist Church in Baird 
with interment .to follow in 
Ross Cemetery, Spencer-
Price Addition. Marcy 
Grun officiated, assisted by 
Rev. Sandra Keith. Parker 
Funeral Home of Baird was 
in charge of arrangements. 

Billy Wayne was born 
July 27, 1967, in Abilene, 
Texas to Alice Faye. Petitt 
and Walter L. Cummings. 
He graduated from Abilene 
High School where he . 
excelled in basketball: .He 
was an avid ' sports fan, 
particularly following . the 

Obituaries • • 
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Sudoku Answer 

Billy Wayne Petitt 
Dallas Cowboys, Texas 

,Longhorns; and all the sports 
and activities of his daughter, 
Kaylee, 

He was a Baptist and had 
lived in Baird for 7 .years, 

moving from Abilene. 

Survivors • include his 

wife, Tiffany Voigts-Petitt 

of Baird; two . daughters, 

KaYlee Voigts of Baird and 

Tenequa Petitt of Fort Worth; 

his mother, Alice Cummings 
of Austin; four.  sisters, 
Felicia, LaDonna, Patricia, 

and Sheila;. one brother, 
Walter; two grandchildren 
and -a -number of nieces and 
nephews. 

Advertise in.. 
the Classifieds 

Helen Ruth Church 

9:30 a.m. Adult, Youth, & Children's Bible Study 
10:30 a.m. Coffee/Donuts 

11:00 a.m. Worship 

Leon River Cowboy Church 
"Just Good Folks Trying To Live For The Lord" 

Pastor Paul Howie 
254-653-2840 

No More 
Forfeiting Grace 

One mile east of the Texas Cattle Exchange 

Remember to 
renew your 
subscription 

ABILN& Helen Ruth 
Church died Friday. May 
29, 2009. 

She was born January 5, 
1931 • in Hamilton. Texas 
to Hiram and Fannie 
Beacham. She married 
Richard Di.'rwood Church 
on August 20, '1948 in 
Abilene. 

Mrs. Church was a 
member of South Side 
Baptist Church where, for 
many years she was active 
in organizing and teaching 
Sunday School. She 
worked outside the home 
for the fariiily business and 
also at a children's clothing 
store. Yet Helen's primary 
calling was to be a mother, 
wife, and homemaker. She 
was the very , definition 
of "devoted mom" and a 
humble servant of Christ. 

GOLDTHWAITE- Hugh 
Wallace Jones, 87, of 
Goldthwaite died at his home 
May 30, 2009. 

Services were held Sunday, 
May 31, 2009 at 3 p.m. at First 
United Methodist Church in 
Goldthwaite. Interment ,was 
at Goldthwaite Memorial 
Ceinetery. 

He was born July 26, 
1921 in Eula, Texas to 
Henry and Fannie Jones. He 
was a member of the First 
United Methodist Church in 
Goldthwaite. He graduated 
from Eula High School in 
1939 as Valedictorian of his 
class. He volunteered for the 
Army Air Corp in 1941. 

He married Maxine 
Newberry on October 17, 
1942. He and Maxine were 
blessed with two children, 
Jerry. Wayne Jones and Patty 
Elouise Jones McCasland. 

Hugh was stationed in San 
Antonio; did his primary 

Ballinger, and was also 
stationed , in i  Brady and 
Lubbock, where he graduated 
and received his wings. He 
received advanced training in 
twin engines and instruments. 
He: was then transferred to 
Pampa as a pilot instructor 
and then on to San Angelo to 
receive bombardier training. 

She vas preceded in death 
. by' her parents. her husband 
Richard. a great-grandson. 
Zachary Church. and a niece. 
Gina Gail Swafford. 

Survivors are a siste 
law., Peggy Swafl'ord three 
sons., Gary Church and wife 
Paula,. Michael.  • Church. 
and, Scott Church and 
wife, Cora; grandchildren, 
Todd, Trey, Jon, -Brian., 
and Melissa Church; and 
great-grandchildren, Brian.  
Jr.; Austin, Addison, and 
Brooklyn Church. 

Servibes were held 
Monday, June 1, 2009. at . 1 
a.m. at the Bailey Funeral 
Home Chapel with Rev: 
David Cason officiating: 
Burial followed in the Clyde 
•CemeterY directed by Bailey. 
Funeral Home.: • 

While in Murfreesboro; 
Tennessee learning to fly 1317  
24's he was hospitalized for 
severe asthma and received 
honorable medical discharge 
in 1944. 

Hugh and Maxine moved 
back ' to Eula' where he 
firmed with his dad for 
several years before entering 
the electrical supervisor of 
Texas Instruments in 19863: 
They then built their hone in, 
Goldthwaite to be closer to• 
family. 

Survivors are his wife, 
Maxine Jones; son, Jerry 
Jones and wife Patricia rof 
Stephenville; ,daUghter, Patty 
McCasland and husband, 
DeWayne of • Goldthwaite; 
grandchildren, Monty arid' 
Kim Jones of Clyde, 'Kim 
BrOwn of Granbury, Laurey 
Green of Stephenville,. 
Gary and • Sonia Leverets; 
of Burleson, Todd LeVereii 
of Stephenvilie, Brent and 
Angie McCasland of 
Angelo, Brooke and Jeremy 
Seely of Waco, and 13 gre4t4i 
grandchildren. 

Memorials may be made to: 
Fosters Home in Stephenville; 
New Horizons inGoldthWaite; 
or, First United MethOdiSt 
Church in Goldthwaite. 

REVERSE MORTGAGE 
TAX FREE - SENIORS 62+ 

FHA INSURED 
Use Your Home Equity 

No Payments 

Homes s60k to s625k 
DON MAPLES 

817-304-0210 
Mortgage Broker Texas License #44378 

www.reversemortgageloansfortexans.com 
5-50 

Hugh Wallace Jones 

Lori Turner Moore 
CLYDE- Lori Turner May 28, 2009 in Little Rock 

Moore, 48, of Sweet Home, Arkansas. 
Arkansas and formerly of 	Arrangements will be by 
Abilene died Thursday, Bailey Funeral Home in 

Clyde. 

.4 0use  Leveling  
voundatiOn Rep 

By David Lee ct Co. 
Professional Work Since 1967 

*Free' Estimates* 
No Payments Until Work Is Satisfactorily 

. 	Completed , 
• Solid Slab • Pier & Beam •Concrete Piers 

Block & Pad • Floor Bracing 
Steel Piers To Bedrock 

Work Guaranteed InsuranCe Claims 

Licensed & BOnded 
254-629-2267 1-888-486-8588 
254-965-5635 	915-675-6369 

www.davicileeandco.com • 



0 
disease caused by 

uncontrolled division 

of abnormal cells 

Creative Coloring 

. 	Celebrate in the sun safely. 
Color in this picture to create your 

own masterpiece. 

Akiuksititatai 

THIS DAY IN... 

HISTORY 
• 1880: A PERFECT 

GAME WAS PITCHED BY 

JOHN LEE RICHMOND. 

• 1939: THE BASEBALL 

HALL OF FAME OPENED 

IN COOPERSTOWN, NY. 

• 1942: ANNE FRANK 

RECEIVED A DIARY FOR 

HER BIRTHDAY. 

WHAT IS THE MOST SERIOUS 

TYPE OF SKIN CANCER? 

VV\IONV11/V :1]AAGNV 

Can you guess what 

the bigger picture is? 

0 
0 

ENGLISH: Skin 

SPANISH: Piel 

ITALIAN: Pelle 

FRENCH: Peau 

GERMAN: Haut 

. 	. 

THE SKIN 15 THE LARGEST ORGAN 

OF THE BODY AND NEEDS TO 

BE PROTECTED FROM THE 

SUN BY USING AN 517F 

PRODUCT. 

Stay Healthy During Grilling Season Slow Aging With Blueberries 
Millions of people enjoy blueberries because they taste 

good and are versatile enough to be part of many different 
menu items. Blueberries, however, are also nutrient-rich 
and offer a host of health benefits, one of which may be 

',slowing down the aging process. 
This isn't to say that blueberries can turn back the hands 

Offline, but they may help slow down some of the typical 
side effects of aging, most notably diminished mental 
capacity. In a USDA Human Nutrition Research Center 
Laboratory study, researchers fed blueberry extractions to 
lab- mice. The extractions were the equivalent of a human 
eating one cup of blueberries per day. The mice were then 
.run-through a series of motor tests. The mice who were 
given the blueberry extractions performed better than the 
control group on !rotor functions and memory. They also 
shbived an increase of exploratory behavior. 
!!' The antioxidant components of blueberries that give 
tbern their vivid color help reduce oxidative stress, as 
observed after looking at the brains of the treated mice. 
Oxidative stress is damage to cell membranes and DNA 
from free radicals. Antioxidants are known to find and 
eradicate free radicals. Oxidative stress is thought to be 
a main culprit in many of the dysfunctions and diseases 
common to aging. 

B'ecause of their neurological, motor-function link, 
blbeberries may be essential to reducing the severity of 
neurological diseases. such as Alzheimer's and other 
demential. 

When it comes to warm 
weather parties, few ideas 
are more popular than 
a 	backyard 	barbecue. 
However, as enjoyable as 
such gatherings can be, they 
can cause problems as well, 
particularly if certain steps 
aren't taken when it comes 
to cooking and handling 
food. 

* Clean your hands: Most 
backyard barbecues feature 
a host of standard fare 
when it comes to the menu. 
Burgers, steaks, hot dogs, 
and poultry are some of 
the most popular items. If 
you're handling raw meat 
and poultry, wash your 
hands between touching 
the meat and then touching 
the poultry. 

* Don't marinate outside:  

Any 	good 	grillmaster 
knows that the key to a 
successful barbecue is how 
well the food is marinated. 
If marinating food for an 
extended period of time, 
keep the food refrigerated 
while marinating. Also, 
be sure not to apply 
leftover marinade to food 
that's already cooked. If 
you're wary of wasting the 
marinade, boil it before 
applying to cooked food. 
The boiling will remove any 
bacteria left in the marinade 
by the raw meat or chicken. 

* Use a meat thermometer: 
Many grill chefs have 
heard cries that their food 
isn't cooked well enough. 
Typically, this is heard after 
someone puts all the fixin's 
on their food. That can make  

continuing to cook the food 
a messy ordeal. To avoid 
such instances, use a meat 
thermometer on burgers 
and steaks. In general. 
burgers should be cooked 
to 160 F, while meats such 
as steaks, roasts or london 
broil can be cooked to 145 
F (medium rare) or 160 F 
(medium). 	Undercooked 
poultry can be especially 
dangerous, so cook to 170 
F. 

* Change utensils and 
plates: Once the food is 
cooked or if you're checking 
to see if it's finished, don't 
use the same utensils to 
remove or check food that 
you used to place it on 
the grill. Also, carry the 
uncooked food out on one 
plate, and present cooked  

food on another plate to 

avoid food contamination. 
Heat a charcoal grill 

properly: If you prefer to 
use a charcoal grill, make 
sure the coals are heated 

for 20 to 30 minutes before 
you put any food on the 
grill. Coals should not still 

be black if you're about to 
commence cooking. Instead, 
they should be gray. 

For tailgaters, cool your 
food as wel: Grilling out isn't 
confined to summertime 

or backyards. Sports fans 
across the nation often take 
their grills to the stadium 

and tailgate before the big 
game. In such cases, make 

sure you bring a food-only 

cooler along. Keep food 
separated and refrigerated 
in the cooler and until it's 
time to do some cooking. 
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The Idle 
American 

6 PKS. DIET PEPSI, Ail DEW OR 
PEP

6 PACK / $1.89 OR 

2 $0150 
FOR 

I T : 

BACON/EGG BISCUIT 
& 16 OZ. COFFEE 	......... 2.09 
SAUSAGE/EGG BISCUIT 
& 16 OZ. COFFEE 	  
BBQ SANDWICH 
& 32 OZ. TALLSUP 	  
HOMESTYLE POPCORN CHICKEN 
& 32 OZ. TALLSUP 	  
SPICY POPCORN CHICKEN 
& 32 OZ. TALLSUP 	  

'2.09 
$2.09 
$2.79 
$2.79 

3 TAMAES, 
& 32 OZ.

L 
 TALLSUP 	  $2.69 

2 HOT LNKS WITH 
& 32 OZ.

I 
 TALLSUP 	

BREAD 
	 $2.59 

2 CORN DOGS 

	

& 32 OZ. TALLSUP 	 $2.69 
CHIMICHANGA 
& 32 OZ. TALLSUP 	 $2.49 
2 BEEF & BEAN BURRITOS 

	

& 32 OZ. TALLSUP 	 '2.69 

COMBO 
NO. 6 

COMBO 
NO. 7 

COMBO 
NO. 8 

BO 
NO. 9 

COMBO 
NO. 10 

stn 

PEPSI SOBE LIFE WATER VARIETY FLAVORS 
99' 20 OZ. 	  

ALLSUP'S ICE CREAM ASSORTED FLAVORS 
2FORS

500  1/2  GALLON ...... 

YELLOW ONIONS 

	 4FOR$  1 C)  

SHURFINE CHARCOAL BRIQUETS 
9 LB. BAG 	  

ALLSUP'S SANDWICH BREAD 
24 OZ. / 894 OR 	 

ALLSUP'S WHEAT BREAD 
24 OZ / 994 OR 	. 

CHARMIN BATH TISSUE 
12 ROLL PKG. 	  

$399 

2 FOR $ 1 49  

2FORS 159 

$699  
CHINET PAPER PLATTERS 
12 CT 	 2FOR$5" 
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Moran Homecoming 
Set For Oct. 23-24 

Classics in 
Cowtown... 

In recent days, thousands 
of fans gathered in Fort Worth 
, eager to be present as some 
of the most talented players 
engaged in world-class 
competition. 

Onlookers, most of them 
envious, were in awe of the 
players in competitions that 
took on marathon status. 

Some of the stars 
challenged the toughest 
musical compositions in the 
Van Cliburn International 
Piano Competition at Bass 
Hall, while others pursued a 
trophy, plaid jacket, and big 
money at the annual Colonial 

Invitational Tournament a 

few miles away. They played 

their hearts out, the former 

conquering the ivories of a 

concert piano, and the latter 

trying to bring a world-

renowned golf course to its 
knees.... 

* * *-* * 

Thousands of folks 

who love piano or golf left 

Cowtown with dreams of 

what might have been. 

"What if" parental pleas 

for piano practice had been 

heeded? "What if" triple-digit 

scorecards had been regarded 

as mere bumps in the road? • 

Too much time is spent, 

no doubt, on thoughts of roads 

not taken, reducing many 

potential stars in music or  

sports to gallery status.... 
* * * * * 

In my early years, well-
intentioned parents tucked 

some money aside for piano 
lessons. 

I attended just one, 

kicking and screaming in 

protest. During the lesson, 

I knocked over a lamp, 
feigned a tummy ache and 

broke into chopsticks while 

the teacher was explaining 

something about "Every 

Good Boy Does Fine." 

By lesson's end, I had 

established a new low mark 

on my teacher's "good boy 

list." Finally, she squared 

my shoulders, looked me 

straight in the eye and said, 

"Don, if you don't shape up 

this minute, I'm going to 

tell your folks that you have 
definite promise."... 

* * * * 

Golf wasn't my thing, 

either. I made the team at 
my tiny high school only 
because five players were 
needed to field a team. I 
was, uh, the number five 
player. 

I would have had to 
shave off at least 20 strokes 
each round to improve my 
status from catastrophic to 
mere embarrassment. 

My coach said if my 
golf game were a prize fight, 
they'd stop it.... 

)1,  )5 )7,  

A country boy, ve 
spent some "what if-.  time 
wondering if my musical or 
athletic propensities might 
have better shined had I been 
reared in a cosmopolitan 
setting. 

Bob Murphey, a speaker 
friend whose stories warmed 
even the coldest cockles, 
loved to tell a story about 
being from the country. 

"Folks from New York 
City think Chicago folks 
are from the country," he'd 
droll. "And people from 
Chicago think the same thing 
about folks from Dallas . 
and Dallas citizens feel like 
Kilgore folks are rural."... 

* * * * * 

One day, his story goes, a 
Kilgore native bristled when 
a visitor suggested (albeit in 
error) that Kilgore had never 
produced any truly famous 
person. 

The local sputtered 
and fumed, but failed to 
challenge the visitor. Later, 
he kicked himself that he 
hadn't thought to mention 
Van Cliburn, the musical 
prodigy who attended 
elementary school there. 

His mental wheels 
spinning, he figured that 
maybe the community 
hadn't really done enough to 
"show oft—  their star on the 
local stage.... 

* * * * * 

He sprang into action. 
He rented the high school 
auditorium, had multi-
colored signs printed for 
barbershop windows, and 
wrote a "come one, come all" 
piece for tile newspap-R-----77--, 

Alas, winter took a 
strangle hold on Kilgore 
on the very day Van 
Cliburn was to perform. 
Highways were iced over, 
and the event organizer 
claimed to be able to keep 
his old pick-up on the road 
only because he had the 
forethought to throw 300 
pounds of chicken feed 
into the truck for. better 
traction. 

Still, a couple of dozen 
citizens showed up, adults 
"paying a dollar, and 
children 12 and under, 
50 cents;" Murphey 
emphasized.... 

* * * * * 

The organizer thanked 
the meager crowd for 
showing up, then turned 
to the youthful Van 
Cliburn, who already held 
international renown. 

"I'm just so sorry 
about the unforeseen 
circumstances, 	Mr. 
Cliburn," he apologized. 
"Given such bad weather 
and with such a sparse 
crowd, we certainly don't 

expect a full program." 

A tear rolled down his 

face as he made a mournful 

plea: "But, since a few of 

us did brave the elements 

to come out, could you 

sang us just one song?"... 
* * * * * 

Dr. Newbury is a 

speaker and writer in 

the Metroplex. Send 

inquiries and comments 

to: newbury@speakerdoc. 

coin. Phone: 817-447-

3872. Web site: www. 
spergerom 

The 2009 Moran 
Homecoming will be 
held on Friday, October 
23 and Saturday, October 
24, according to an 
announcement by the Moran 
Ex-Student & Teacher 
Association. The Moran 
Bulldogs are scheduled to 
host the Blackwell Hornets 
for the homecoming 
football game on Friday 
night, with the remaining 
homecoming 	activities 
scheduled on Saturday 
as usual. A parade and 
street dance are among the 
activities being considered 
this year, in addition to the 
traditional exes program. 
The Ex-Student & Teacher 

The 2009 Callahan County 
Riding Club season kicked 
off on Saturday, May 2nd at 
the arena on FM 603 in Eula 
with other dates throughout 
the summer. 

At 6 p.m. there was a 
membership drive so that 
everyone can get the re-
quired Coggins papers 
filed and membership dues 
paid. The play day began 
at 7 p.m. with a grand en-
try and fun for everyone. 
The concession stand was 
up and running. Everyone is 
encouraged to come out to 
these playdays. 

The schedule for the 2009 
season is below. All regu-
larly scheduled play days 
will begin with trainers/ex-
ilibitions at 6:30 and the 

Association will hold 
a meeting very soon to.  
discuss plans for this 
year's 	homecoming. 
although a meeting date 
has not yet been finalized. 
In the meantime, if you 
would like to volunteer 
to help with this year's 
homecoming or if you 
need further information 
please contact Duston 
Brooks at (325) 945-3145, 
Aline McCormack at 945-
3715, Jo Ellen Hise at 945-
2199 or send an e-mail 
to 	Inman h o intcalini 
aol.com. Please make 
plans to attend this year's 
homecoming. • 

events beginning at, 7 p.m., 
Check us out on the web for 
updates at hyperlink http:/// 
www.callahancountyrid-
ingclub.com 

June Dates: Saturday, 
June 6th; Sunday, June 14th 
(NBHA); Saturday, June 
20th; Saturday, June 27th; 
Sunday, June 28th (NBHA) 

August Dates: Saturday, 
August 8th; Saturday, Au-
gust 15th; Saturday, August 
22nd; Saturday, August 
29th. 

Any rain-outs or make-
up days will be held on the 
open weekend or on Fri-
days or Sundays, depend-
ing on weather and options 
of membership. If you have 
questions call Sue Under-
wood at 325-669-9411. 

Callahan County Riding Club 
2009 Play Dates Announced 

Cisco - Eastland 
Ranger - Baird 

BLUE BUNNY VANILLA, NEOPOLITAN OR MISSISSIPPI MUD 

BIG SANDWICHES 
6 OZ. 

ASSORTED FLAVORS GALLON 

RED DIAMOND 
TEA 

FOR
$n  

lir 
BUY ONE 12 OZ. BAR.S 

FRANKS 
GET ONE 8 CT. 

TENDER CRUST HOT DOG 

BUNS 

 

Prices Good Thru 6/13/09 

 

BUY 12 
GALLONS 
OF FRESH 
ALLSUP'S 
MILK... 

JACK LINK'S 

FOR 1 
2 $99 

7 



Carbon, Gorman, 
Olden, Morton Valley, 
•Desdemona, Kokomo 

Country Wide Classifieds 
Cisco Press • Eastland Telegram • Ranger Times • Rising Star•Baird Star 

Thursday, June 4, 2009 

Strawn, Nlingus, 
Gordon, Putnam, 

Lake Leon,Flatwoods 

FHA Advertising 
Rule: 
FHA makes it il-
legal "to make, 
print, or pub-
lish, or cause to 
be made, print-
ed, or published, 
any notice, state-
ment, or adver-
tisement, with 
respect to the 
sale or rental 
of a dwelling, 
that indicates 
any preference, 
limitation, 	or 
discrimination 
because of race, 
color, religion, 
sex, handicap, 
familial status, 
or national ori-
gin, or an inten-
tion to make any 
such preference, 
limitation, 	or 
discrimination." 

REAL 
ESTATE 

Desdemona, 4 A 
m/I, 3-1 frame, well 
& septic, shop, stg. 
Bldg., beautiful lo-
cation, large trees. 
$59,900. 

38 A M/L south 
Gorman: Fronts FM 
679, about 10 A 

_ large Pecan Trees, 
nice location for 
pond, good fences, 
sandy land. $2,200 

-.acre. Seller Financ-
in 

NEW: Gorman, 
44A, 2-2-2 bi-level 
_frame home, 1728 
-Sf, central a/h, metal 
roof; covered upper 
.deck, several wells, 
buildings, coastal. 
:Deer & other wild- 
life. $250,000 

130 A, west 
Carbon, app. 40 a 

• cult, 35 a coastal, 
pond, elec., county 
water. $2,400 acre 

156 A Carbon, 
1/2 wooded- 1/2 
fields, lots deer & 
turkey, 3 ponds, 
nice 2-2 mh, cen-
tral a/c, barn, cor-
ral, county water. 
Hunter's Paradise! 
$4,000 acre. 

179 A south 
of Gorman: Part 
wooded, part old 
fields, deer & hogs, 
2 nice ponds, sandy 
soil, elec., several 
water wells, cabin, 
$2,350 acre 

Selling Coman-
che, Eastland and 
Brown Counties 
since 1954 and we 
WANT to sell yours. 
We solicit and ap-
preciate your list-
ings. 
COGBURN REAL 

ESTATE 
DE LEON 
OFFICE 

(254) 893-6666 
HOME 893-2642 

758-2401 
www. cogburnreal 

estate.com 
RS104 

HOUSE 
FOR SALE 

BUSINESS 
SERVICES 

HELP 
. WANTED 

Love's Travel Stops & Country Stores 
is hiring in Ranger, TX 

Tire/Maintenance Technicians 
Tire or Lube exp. preferred 

Criminal check required 
Driver's License required 

Up to $10+ hr. DOE 

Apply at: 
Love's Travel Stop #270 

1600 Loop 254 West 
Ranger, TX 76470 

(254) 647-3700 	4S 

RED STAR TRUCK STOP 

Is Now 
Hiring 

For a Cook 

Apple at Red Star Truck Stop 
Corner of HHv 6 & 1-20 • Eastlandw  

I 

GARAGE 
SALES 

EASTLAND 
YARD SALE: 802 
Oakhollow, East-
land. Saturday, June 
6, 8:00-2:00. 

E45 

LAKE LEON 
HUGE 2 FAMILY 
SALE: Tools, air con-
ditioner, apt. stove, 
antiques, clothes, 
old mowers, cattle 
panels, fishing stuff, 
tool boxes, dishes, 
tires, ladders, lawn 
chairs, fish cooker, 
loads of stuff. Friday 
& Saturday, June 5 
& 6. 8 a.m.-? Staff 
Road at Lake Leon 
first house on left. 
631-0719. 

E45 

RANGER 
GARAGE SALE: 
June 5-7, 8:00 
a.m. -until. Lots of 
plus size women's 
clothes, size 36 X 
32 mens jeans, and 
too many odds and 
ends to name. Multi-
family-435 & 437 
West Main, Ranger. 

R45 
-------- 

GARAGE SALE: 
Friday 	evening, 
June 5 from 5 p.m. 
to 8 p.m. and Satur-
day, June 6 from 7 
a.m. to 1 p.m. Two 
family sale includes 
childrens' clothing 
and numerous other 
items located at 209 
Breckenridge Road, 
Ranger. 

R46 

THREE FAMILY 
YARD SALE: 515 
Mesquite St., Rang-
er. 8:00-5:00 Satur-
day, June 6th. 

R45 

GARAGE SALE: 
Thursday & Friday, 
June 4-5 912 Wal-
nut St., Ranger. Too 
much to list! 

E45 

AUTOS 
FOR SALE 

For Sale: '05 Extra 
Loaded Platinum 
(The Big One) Lin-
coln Escalade, 7 
seater. Has every 
feature. New rub-
ber. Ready for many 
vacations. $13,000 
OBO plus take up 
payments. Call to 
see 254-629-2413, 

E104 

Vacation Special 
For Sale: Loaded 
'01 GMC Luxury 
Van; TV, bucket 
seats, fold down 
third. excellent rub-
ber. Ready for many 
vacations. $5.000 
OBO. Call 254-629-
2413. 

E104 

Cisco Press 442-2244 	 Eastland Telegram 629-1707 	 Toll Free 888-227-1708 

MOBILE 
HOMES 

3 Acres w/NEW 3/2 
Home $479/month, 
5,75%, 30 NTs. $500 
Dn. Stove, Refer, DW 
Washer/Drver & Cen-
tral AC! 
TrinityHomeSales.com 

866-672-1499 
RET34090 • 

FOR RENT 

Taking rental appli-
cations on 2 bed-
room mobile homes. 
No pets. Work and 
rental references re-
quired. Rent $350-
$450 plus deposit. 
254-629-1848. 

E104 

Commercial prop-
erty for lease, 700 
square feet, office 
space, brand new 
construction, build 
to suit. $600 mth. 
For more informa-
tion call 254-485-
9159. 

E104 

FOR LEASE OR 
SALE: 2 large com-
mercial bldgs on 
2 acres fenced 
w/I-20 	frontage- 
Eastland. Owner 
financing. 	Dean 
623-979-6732. 

E104 

APTS FOR 
RENT 

For Rent: 2 BR, 1 
BA, 1221 Oddie St., 
Ranger, TX. $400 a 
month, $250 depos-
it. 254-968-4420. 

E104 

CEDAR RIDGE 
APARTMENTS 

Clean Unfurnished 
Apartments 
Security Guard on 
grounds 
Maintenance 
Total Electric 
Laundry 
Central Heat/Air 
Near Schools/Hos-
pital 
No Pets 
254-629-2805 

E104 

COUNTRY VILLA 
APARTMENTS 

1-2 bedrooms, kitch-
en appliances, Cen-
tral H/A, W/D, pool. 
On site security and 
maintenance. 
(Behind Pizza Inn) 

1099 Lago Vista 
Blvd. Eastland, Tex-
as. Call 629-2769 
or 631-9504. If no 
answer 629-2348. 

E104 

EASTLAND 
VILLAGE 

APARTMENTS 
600 W. Sadosa 
Eastland, Texas 

76448 
(254) 629-2518 

REDUCED 
UTILITY COST 

MOVE-IN SPECIAL 
1-2-3 Bedrooms 
Call or come by 
Near Schools 
Central A/C 

E104 

GHOLSON 
HOTEL APTS 

If you are 62 years 
of age or older, or 
18 and older and 
disabled and look-
ing for a nice quiet 
historic place to 
live, come to 215 W. 
Main, in Ranger or 
call Richard at 254-
647-1513 (Income 
limits apply). 

APTS 
FOR RENT 
KING MANOR 
APARTMENTS 

107 Blundell 
Ranger 

(254) 647-1722 
1, 2, 3 

BEDROOMS 
•Ranger & 

Refrigerator 
•Central Heat & Air 

•Equal Housing 
•Handicap 
Accessible 

Conveniently 
Located! 

Call or Visit Us 
Today 

Mon.-Thurs. 
9:00 AM-11:00 AM 

Or Call for 
Appointment 

R104 

ROYAL OAKS 
APARTMENTS 

Unfurnished 1 and 
2 Bedroom; Car-
pet, Drapes, & 
Kitchen" Appliances 
Furnished. Water, 
Trash Pickup & TV 
Cable Paid. Also 
Laundry Room at 
complex. Choice 
neighborhood. See 
and compare at 
1304 Royal Lane, 
Cisco, or call 442-
3232. Vacancies not 
always available. 

C104 

HELP 
WANTED 

DRIVER NEEDED 
To drive our truck 
Excellent pay 
Excellent benefits 
Home every day 
Apply in person at 
Morgan Buildings in 
Eastland 

E104 

Full time contract 
oil and gas pumper 
needed, must have 
experience 	and 
truck, must live with-
in 15 miles of Cisco. 
Send resume to 
Eastland Telegram, 
Dept. A, PO Box 
29 Eastland, Texas 
76448. 

E46 

RANGER CARE 
CENTER 
A privately owned, 
skilled nursing facil-
ity 
We are currently ac-
cepting applications 
for: 

CNA and 
Weekend RN 

Competitive wages 
Work in a friendly, 
family-oriented en-
vironment . 
Apply in person at: 
460 W. Main St. 
Ranger, TX 76470 
For more info: con-
tact Renee at (254) 
647-3111 E.O.E. 

R104 

Homestead Nursing 
& Rehabilitation of 
Gorman is accepting 
applications 	for 
CNA's for all shifts. 
Apply in person at 
600 W. Roosevelt, 
Gorman, TX. EEOC 

E104 

RANGER CARE 
CENTER 

A privately owned, 
skilled 	nursing 
facility 
We are currently 
accepting 
applications for: 

Office Assistant 
(Must have High 
School Diploma or 
equivalent, basic 
computer 	skills 
and be able to 
multitask) 
Competitive wages, 
work in a friendly, 
family-oriented 
environment. 
Apply in person at.  

HELP 
WANTED 

460 W. Main St. 
Ranger, TX 76470 
For more info: 
Contact Renee at 
(254) 	647-3111 
E.O.E. 

R104 

City of Ranger is 
now 	accepting 
applications 
for 	SUMMER 
LIFEGUARDS. 
Applicants 	may 
apply at Ranger 
City 	Hall. 	The 
positions require a 
current Red Cross 
Lifeguard training 
Certificate including 
CPR and First Aid 
Training. Red Cross 
Certification classes 
can be attained 
in Abilene and 
Breckenridge, come 
by City Hall for more 
information. 

R47 

City of Ranger 
The City of Ranger 
is now accepting 
applicatons for our 
Water & Street 
Departments. 
Previous experience 
and/or a Class 
"C" Water License 
Operator would be 
beneficial. Rate of 
pay DOE. Apply at 
City Hall, M-F, 8-5. 
Applications will be 
taken until position 
is filled. The City 
of Ranger is an 
equal opportunity 
employer. 

R45 

Wahted: ' Part-time 
help with landscape 
and clean-up work. 
Must be sober, drug-
free, dependable 
with transportation. 
Call 442-2332 after 
6:00 PM. 

C46 

Now taking applica-
tions for all shifts. 
Apply in person 
Smokin 	Willie's 
2009 Conrad Hilton, 
Cisco. 

C104 

Sonic Drive-In look-
ing for friendly em-
ployees cook and 
car hops. Also man-
agement opportu-
nity. Apply in person 
Cisco Sonic. 

C104 

Valentino's Italian 
Restaurant & Pizza 
now hiring for the 
following positions: 

Wait Staff 
Dishwasher 

Cashier 
Apply in person. 

E104 

Now Hiring For 
All Phases of 

Housing 
Construction 

•Starting 	Pay 
$10.00/hr. 

HELP 
WANTED 

•Paid Vacation & 
Holidays 
•Medical 
•Dental 
•Life Insurance 
•401 k with 100% 
match up to 6% 
•Team Profit Shar-
ing 
•Excellent Work 
Environment 
Apply in person at 

Karsten Homes 
820 Industrial Blvd 
Breckenridge, TX 

76424 
It's All...About 

You® 
Karsten Homes 
Division of CMH 
Manufacturing 

E104 

BUSINESS 
SERVICES 

Digital antenna not 
working? Call John 
with All American 
Satellite for clear 
TV picture 325-232-
2156. 

E46 

HETRICK 
REMODELING 

Home Remodeling, 
Repairs, Patio & 
Pool Decks, Floors, 
Doors, Windows, 
Drywall, 	Cabinet 
Building. 
Quality Workman-
ship is No. 1 With 
Usl 

Owner, 
William Hetrick 

Cell 254-479-0929.  
TRCC Registered 

E52 

'We Buy EStates 
Large or Small 
254-629-2915 
254-631-9316 

E62 

CHAD'S LAWN 
SERVICE 

254-631-6777 
254-631-1920 
Call for all your 

lawn service 
needs!!! 

E49 

CLIPPERS 
LAWN & TREE 

SERVICE 
Commercial & 

Residential 
Mowing, trimming, 
fertilizing, weed & 

insect control 
Tree trimming & 

removal. 
Reasonable Prices 

Free Estimates 
Call 

Rocky McQuain 
254-442-2382 

E52 

AQUASCAPES 
LANDSCAPING 

Specializing in wa- 
ter features, 

full lawn care needs 
Beat any price 

No job too small 
Alan 254-334-9316 

or 
Steve 817-403- 

0957 

E45 

RANDY'S 
HANDYMAN 

SERVICE 
Plumbing such as 
hot water heater re- 
placement, leaks or 
drain problems also 
lawn care and home 
repair. 
Call Randy 254-
488-2040. 

E49 

Buck's Gun 
School 

Concealed 
Handgun License 

Classes 
Any Day 

Call Buck at 
254-647-1449 

R48 

Shih Tzu Puppy 6-8 
weeks old $250.00. 
647-3770. 

E46 

Free: 2 precious 
gray kittens to good 
homes, Cisco 254-
631-8320. 

C47 

WANTED 

Want To Rent: 
House in country 
around Cisco area, 
254-498-1597. 

C46 

Wanted: 	Ranch 
for lease for graz-
ing cattle, primarily 
cow/calf operation. 
In or around East-
land County. 817-
243-4984. 

R104 

GARAGE 
SALES 

CISCO 
2 FAMILY GARAGE 
SALE: 1003 West 
16th, Cisco. A little 
bit of everything. 

C45 

GARAGE SALE: 
Friday, June 5th, 
1:00 until 5:00, Sat. 
8:00 to 5:00. Dishes, 
glassware, wall de-
cor, books, shoes, 
dolls, chairs, what 
nots. Decluttering 
House Auction and 
Estate items. Big 
Sale 309 W. 12th, 
Cisco. 

C45 

HUGE GARAGE 
SALE: 	Furniture, 
antique trunks, cast 
iron pans, clothes, 
knives, 	swords, 
glassware 	and 
much more. 208 W. 
10th, Cisco. 9 a.m.-
? Friday, Saturday, 
Sunday, June 5,6,7. 

C45 

YARD SALE: Friday, 
June 5 & Sat., June 
6, 8 a.m.-? 612 W. 
7th, Cisco. Antique 
furniture, 	lamps, 
Serger sewing ma-
chine, clothes, elec-
tronics, toys, home 
decor, lots of misc. 

C45 

ADVERTISE 
IN THE 

CLASSIFIEDS 

GARAGE 
SALES 

CISCO 
HUGE SALE: Sat., 
June 6. Tools, 
plumbing supplies, 
garden tub, sinks, 
air cond., nice la-
dies clothes, men's 
good Wranglers, 
western shirts, bar 
stools, 	furniture, 
western hope chest, 
curtains, bedding. 
5407 Hwy 6 1/2 
mile past lake cut 
off. Signs. 

C45 
------------ 

EASTLAND 
GARAGE SALE: 
1311 W. Plummer 
(across from Park 
Hill) Saturday, June 
6, 8:00 a.m.-until. 

E46 

GARAGE SALE: 
1500 W. Com-
merce. Friday & 
Saturday 8:00 till 
? No early arrivals 
please. 

E45 

YARD SALE: Sat., 
June 6, 8:00 till ?. 
202 S. Ammerman. 
Good stuff! Home 
decor, 	children's 
clothing, 	small 
kitchen appliances, 
paper back books, 
many misc. items. 

E46 

BACKYARD SALE: 
1005 W. Com-
merce. Friday, June 
5, 8:00-2:00; Sat., 
June 6 8:00-2:00. 
Lots of everything, 
cheap!!! 

E45 

YARD SALE: Sat., 
June 6 8 a.m.- 
? 	Miscellaneous 
items. 401 E. Sa-
dosa, Eastland. 

E45 

LARGE GARAGE 
SALE: Saturday, 
June 6, 500 Oak-
wood Dr., East-
land, 8-2. Items for 
men, women, and 
children including 
fold-up bed, metal 
work table, boys 
clothes, sizes 3T-7, 
good kid toys, end 
tables, comforter 
sets, sheets, house-
wares, home decor, 
boy's tuxedo, weed 
eater, pipe, adult 
clothing all sizes, 
too much to list. 

E45 

HELP 
WANTED 

E48 

2 Bedroom, 2 Bath 
Brick Home, CH/A, 
recent update on all 
electrical & plumb-
ing, • 1108 Avenue 
A.. 5 lots in Cisco, 

- 362.000 254-631-
- 7862. 

E45 

2 Bedroom, 1 Bath 
sits on 3 lots, new 	  
roof, partially re- 
modeled. 	303 
W. 18th, Cisco. 
$52,500. Call 254-
442-4393. 

R104 

READ THE 
CLASSIFIEDS 

HELP WANTED 
CHOICE POSITION 

Available in Eastland to 
qualified person. 

Must have people personality 
for wide area, generous com- 
mission sales to professional 

applicants. Resume and 
good references required. 

See if you can sell yourself to 
us: 

Apply in person 
215 S. Seaman - Eastland 



Lizza's Maids 
Pop-ins 

Cleaning Service & More 

254-629-3335i  
• Clean homes or business 

• Remodeling 
• Painting 

• Redecorating 
• Moving Furniture and More 

47 

Thursday, June 4, 2009 

Public Invited To Cottonwood 
Festival To Be Held June 19 

Narcotics Anonymous 
500 Ave. E (Ex-GI Bldg.) 

Cisco, TX 76437 
Monday 8:00 p.m. 

Open Meetings 
Wednesday 12:00 noon 

Friday 6:00 p.m. 
Book Study 

For more information 
contact 254-442-4462 

Grandpaw's Tool Shed 
Rental, Inc. 

1304 E. Main, 
Eastland, TX 76448 

254-629-3363 
Tired of all the same entertainment at 
your parties? 
We have the solution: Rent our New 
"Dunking Booth**. A lot of fun for the 
whole family. 

Also we have Temporary Storage 
Containers 8 x 20 at your location for 
rent. 	 104 

A-QUALITY WELDING 
& STEEL SUPPLY 

: 	METAL BUILDINGS - STRUCTURAL STEEL 
..--- .--•  • FABRICATION • BUILDING COMPONENT 
‘4,,y  • WELDING SUPPLIES & GASES 

EAT 	Met& Bkig_ Clearance Sale Call Now 
700 East 1-20 Cisco, TX 

(254) 442-3036 
Check out our prices updated daily 	wrirre.aqualitysteel.rpet 

Alcoholics Anonymous., 
302 N: College 

Eastland, TX 76448 
4-4-4- 	

- 

MONDAY 6:00 p.m. (Closed- 
Alcoholics Only) 

TUESDAY 8:00 p.m. (Open). 
THURSDAY 6:00 p.m. (Open) 

Big Book Study 
SATURDAY 8:00 p.m. (Open) 

*** 

442-4462 or 254-433-3340 
For questions or info. call 

254-631-0271 
Parole/Probationers Welcome 
Please No Correctional Papers 

Notice: 
Available At 

The Telegram: 
•Texas Messengers 

•The True Story of Old Rip 

•Definative Home Business 

Income Opportunty Survey 

•The Story of Old Rip A Honred 

Toad 

•An American Sampler of 

People You Might Know 

•To Jean 

•Medicine Show Revisted 

'Santa Claus Bank Robbery 

•Quit Smoking Personal Letter 

•The Ranger Story 

•The Story of My Life By Myself 

aouse Leveling  
"foundation Repa; 

By David Lee & Co. 
Professional Work Since 1967 

*Free Estimates* 
No Payments Until Work Is Saiisfactorily 

Completed 
• Solid Slab • Pier & Beam • Concrete Pier, -• 

Block & Pad • 1-loor Bracing 
Steel Piers To Bedrock 

Work Guaranteed Insurance Claims _ _ 

Licensed & Bonded 

254-629-2267 	1-888-486-8588 
254-965-5635 	915-675-6369 

dioidleeandco.com 	10.4 

I 

Cisco Press - Eastland Telegram - Ranger Times-Rising Star-Baird Star 	 e-cinc.com 

a 
at Carbon City Hall on Friday and 
Saturday you can pick up a map at 
Carbon Agri Center. List of Sales: 

Waldene Stephenson 610 CR 189 

Tracy Plum 2 Family Sale 711 S. 

Main 

SueElla Stratton 309 E. Diamond 

Ashley Sandlin 407 W. Anthracite 

Ellen Kanady 300 E. Brush 

Charles Stewart 200 Ave C 

Gerald Harris 408 Ave G. 
Pam Smith (Cozart's) 203 N. Main 
Veena Maples 402 4th St. 

Dale Griffin (King Signs) 
Coal 

Bryan Kunze 301 S. Main 

FOR SALE . 

Discounted Steel 
Bldgs 
Big & Small 
Standard or Cus-
tom Design 
Get the Deal of 
Deals! 
Mfg to Site 
www.scg-grp.corn 
Source#0Q7 
Phone: 254-230-
0059 

E45 

Double/Full ortho-
pedic mattress set. 
FLAME RESIS-
TANT, warranty. 
$149 	325-428- 
9172. 

E45 

MUST SELL brand 
new King pillowtop 
mattress and box, 
in plastic. $269 325-
428-9172. 

E45 

Body contouring 
memory foam mat-
tress and founda-
tion, still wrapped 
with warranty. $375. 
325-428-9172. 

E45 

Sacrifice a leather 
couch/loveseat will 
include 3-pc table 
set, brand new nev-
er used $649. 325-
428-9172. 

E45 

Microfiber 	living 
room set Solid 
wood construction/ 
lifetime warranty 
tables too, New 
must sell $525. Can 
• separate. 325-428- 
9172. 

E45 

Steel Buildings 
Recession Disc. 
18 x 21 Reg $6,279 
Now $4,186 
36 x 51 Reg $15,047 
Now $10,031 
105 x 105 Reg 
$87,362 	Now 
$58,241 
+Code Adj 
Erection Avail 
www.scg-grp.com 
Source #0YP 
254-488-4242 

E48 

FOR 
SALE 

For Sale: Like New 
20 Gauge Shotgun, 
Model IZH 27 Over/ 
Under, 	Beautiful 
Wood Stock, Vented 
Rib, Select Trigger, 
3 Chokes. $500.00. 
Call 254-631-8938. 

E47 

NOTICES 

CISCO DEVELOP-
MENT CORPORA-
TION is accepting 
bids for lot shred-
ding, mowing and 
trimming CDC prop-
erties located in 
Cisco, Texas. Lot 
lists, spec sheets 
and other require-
ments are available 
at the CDC office, 
309 Conrad Hilton 
Ave, Cisco, TX. 

C46 

THANK 
YOU 

We would like to 
thank everyone for 
their love and sup-
port during the ex-
tended illness and 
death of our loved 
one, Traci Parks. 
We want to thank the 
Leon River Cowboy 
Church for the noon 
meal before the ser-
vice and the love 
and support shown 
to our family. Also, 
we want to thank all 
our friends, loved 
ones and families in 
the community for 
the food, flowers, 
prayers, visits and 
continual support. 
We are blessed to 
be a part of such a 
giving and caring 
community. 
Tom, Hailey, Travis 

& Joani Parks 

BUSINESS 
SERVICES 

SPECIAL 
SERVICES 

AVAILABLE: 
CONSUMER 
PLUMBING 

CONSULTANT: 
50+ years expe- 
rience all kinds 
Eastland 	area 
installation and 
maintenance 
qualifies MAS-
TER PLUMBER 
ROY LEE SMITH 
to fairly and eco-
nomically advise 
residential and 
commercial cus-
tomers about their 
plumbing needs 
and problems. 
Call 254-629-2995 
for HELP today! 
You'll be glad you 
did. 

News from the 
Majestic Theater 
this week is that the 
movie "Night AtThe 
Museum: Battle Of 
The Smithsonian" 
is being held over 
for another weekend 
here. That will give 
local theater fans an-
other chance to see 
this new film, which 
has been first in the 
box office across the 
country. 

It will show again 
from Friday, June 
5 through Monday, 
June 8. Doors at 
the Majestic will be 
open at 7 p.m. night-
ly, with curtain time 
7:30. General admis-
sion will be $4.50 at 
the box office, with 
balcony seats $6.00 
(adults only). 
The film is rated as 

"There's no place 
like home!" There re-
ally is no place like 
home! And the 
good news is that 
this event is close to 
your home! Come 
join Dorothy, Toto, 
Scarecrow, Tin Man, 
and the Cowardly 
Lion as they journey 
down the yellow brick 
road.. for Dublin Dr 
Pepper's big birthday 
bash. On June 13, 
2009, the oldest Dr 
Pepper bottling plant 
in the world, located 
in Dublin, Texas, will 
celebrate its 118th 
Birthday. This year's 
begins on Monday, 
June 8 when for one 
week, the Dublin city 
limit signs are changed 
to read "Dr Pep-
per, Texas." Friday 
night, June 12,Alley-
fest will kick off with 
only the best in arts 
and crafts displayed 
in Dublin's Hogan's 
Alley. Festivities in-
clude great live mu-
sic by Layne Golden 
and the 10-2-4 Band 
AND as night begins 
to settle in, there will 
be a hot air balloon 
glow. 

Early Saturday, 
June 13, is when the 
real fun begins--start-
ing with the 10-2-4k 
runs. No matter what 
level runner you are, 
we've got the run for 
you! The 10-2-4k run 
is a charity event with, 
all proceeds going 
to the Dublin Lions 
Club. For on-line 
registration and in-
formation for the 10-
2-4K please visit our  

PG-13, and is a fam-
ily-type comedy. It 
also has some edu-
cational sidelights 
and interesting pho-
tography. 

The movie is ac-
tually a sequel to 
the popular "Night 
At The Museum," 
which showed in 
2006. It also stars 
Ben Stiller, who 
helps carry the story 
along at a fast clip. 
Stiller has a good 
back-up cast. 	• 

In this new story, 
Larry Daly (Stiller) 
is no longer a secu-
rity guard drudge, 
making minimum 
wages guarding the 
Museum Of Natu-
ral History (NYC) 
at night. Instead, 
the good-natured 
dreamer has turned 

website. 
New this year, will 

be the first ever Tour 
de Pepper Bike ride. 
Dublin Dr Pepper 
has joined hands with 
Kids Across Cultures 
to bring 9, 34 and 
62 mile courses that 
wind down country 
roads throughout the 
Cross Timbers area. 
More information and 
on-line registration 
is available at our 
website. 

Beginning at 10 
am •on Saturday, there 
will be plenty of en-
tertainment to fill the 
rest of the day. This 
year's birthday theme 
is "There's No Place 
Like Home". Live 
40s big band sounds 
like Judy Garland, 
Frank Sinatra, and 

Call 

254-629-1707 

to 
advertise 

in this 
section 

into an inventor of 
gadgets. 

But then he learns 
that some of his fa-

vorite exhibits at the 

Museum of Natural 

History have been 

sent to the Smith- 

sonian 	Museum 

(Washington D.C.) 

for storage. 

So he decides to 
infiltrate the Smith-

sonian and check 
them out. He is 
afraid they may be 
in danger from an 
ancient Pharaoh and 
some other charac-
ters who refuse to 
stay put. 
Daly was right, and 
what follows keeps 
him mighty busy 
until this problem is 
solved! 

the Rat Pack will play 
throughout the day. 
There will be a 'horse 
of a different color' 
carriage rides, lots of 
inflatable games for 
kids of all ages, an art 
and photography con-
test, and free Dublin 
Dr Pepper flows like 
a fountain all day. 
Visitors will be treat-
ed to free tours of 
the oldest Dr. Pepper 
bottling plant in the 
USA and the world-
famous Dublin Dr. 
Pepper museum. Al-
so, to make this the 
perfect family event, 
there will be a wide 
variety of carnival 
games and food 
booths - all operat-
ed by and benefiting 
charitable organiza-
tions. And of course, 
everyone will share in 

Larry Singley 
Toll Free 800-992-9122 

or 817-992-9122 
We Solve Storage Problems 

Dublin Dr Pepper's 
huge 118th birthday 
cake. 

The annual birth-
day party, which be-
gan in 1991 when 
the plant observed its 
100th birthday, is a 
"thank you" celebra-
tion from the Dub-
lin Dr Pepper Bot-
tling Co. and parent 
company, Dr Pep-
per Snapple Group 
to their customers. 
All proceeds from 
the birthday celebra-
tion benefit local and 
area non-profit and 
charitable organiza-
tions. So you are 
invited to join Dublin 
Dr. Pepper and stroll 
back in time on the 
yellow brick road to 
celebrate some of the 
special things that 
made America great. 
For more informa-
tion, please contact 
Lori Dodd or Rhon-
da Jeske at 254-445-
4210, email us at dr-
peppertx gembarq-
rnail.com or visit our 
website at www.dub-
lindrpepper.com. 

Rhonda Jeske 
Old Doc's Soda 
Shop 

Dublin Dr Pepper 
Bottling Co. 
(254) 445-42 I 0 
www.dubl indrpepper. 
coin 

Advertise in the 
Business Services 

section 
call 629-1707 

Master Electrician 
All Types of Work 

254-639-2964 
254-433-1782 

State Licensed 
104 

Come out to 
Cottonwood 	on 
Friday, June 19th 
for an Olde Time 
Musical and Benefit 
Spaghetti Supper, 
the proceeds of 
which will go 
towards repair and 
maintenance 	at 
the 	Cottonwood 
Community Center. 

The Spaghetti 
Supper starts at 
5 p.m. with the 
music 	following 
at 6:30. Hear Olde 
Time 	Country 
Music performed 
by musicians from 
the old Cottonwood 
Musicals and some 
musicians that are 
new to Cottonwood. 

The Cottonwood 
Community Center,  

which was once 
the community's 
schoolhouse, 	is 
under the care of 
the 	CottonWooil 
Historit•ail 
Association, which 
also oversees '. 'tlie 
old Post Offi4, 
Methodist Church. 
and two cemeteries. 
The building is 
located on CR- 446, 
off of FM 880..in  
Cottonwood, 
miles North of erois 
Plains. 

If you would like 
to help with the 
benefit, either • by 
donating or helpipg 
serve, please contact 
Beverly Brown. :at 
254725-7369  for 
Dena Nickerson -.at 
254-725-6377. - 

	  NOTICE OF PUB- 
Must Sell Steel LIC SALE of prop-
Buildings from 2008 erty to satisfy land- 
Inventory Cancella- 	lord's lien. Sale is 
tions, one is 30 x 10 am, June 18, 
42, Will Sell For Bal- 2009, at 1351 East 
ance Owed. Freight Main, Eastland, TX. 
Paid to Texas. Call Property will be sold 
1-800-552-8504. 	to highest bidder for 

RS45 cash. Cleanup and 

	

 	removal deposit may 
Brand New Queen be required. Seller 
pillowtop mattress reserves the right to 
2 pc set, in plastic withdraw property 
Original warranty from sale. Prop- 
$169 	325-428- erty includes con- 
9172. 	 tests belonging to 

E45 LARRY BARNES, 
household goods. 
Contact Main Street 
Storage at 254-631-
7762. 

E47 

107 E. 

`Night At The Museum' To Show Again 

Dublin Dr. Pepper's 118th Birthday June 13 

Carbon City Wide Garage Notice Of 
Meet 

Sale Saturday, June 6 	Friday ing  
Carbon City Wide Garage Sales 	Notice is hereby 

	

Saturday, June 6th. You can pick up given 	that 

map of sales on Thursday, June 4th Eastland 	County 
Commissioner's 
Court will meet in 
a Special Meeting 
at 9:00 a.m. on 
Friday, June 5, 2009 
in Eastland County 
Commissioner's 
Courtroom, 
Eastland, 	Texas, 
to consider the 
following agenda 
items: 

1. Open and 
accept bids for 
HVAC and electric 
in DistrictAttorney's 
and Tax Assessor/ 
Collector's Offices 

	

2. 	Discuss and 
consider additional 
electrical supply for 
the Courthouse 

Posted by order 
of Eastland County 
Commissioner's 
Court 

Any of the above 
and foregoing agen-
da items, which re-
quire action, may 
be acted upon by 
the Commissioner's 

	

Court 	• 

BUSINESS SERVICES 



Obituaries 
Kenneth Dale Farmer 

v 

MAJESTIC THEATRE 
629-1322 

NIGHT AT THE MUSEUM: 
BATTLE OF THE SMITHSONIAN 

Rated PG 

Starring 
Ben Stiller, Amy Adams, 

- 	Robin Williams 

Fri. Sat. Sun. Mon. 
All Showings: 7:30 p.m. - $4.50 

Adults Only Balcony Ticket - $6.00 
10-Admission Card - $40.00 
5-Admission Card - $22.50 

EAT RISING UTILITY BILLS 
INSTALL PREMIUM GRADE VINYL WINDOWS 

1 
Increases Energy 
Savings 
Double-Pane 
Insulating Glass 

Reduces Noise 
Outside 

100% Transferable 
Lifetime Warranty 

5 UP To 120 U.i. 

PLUS INSTALLATION 
INCLUDES Low E 

& ARGON 

Clearaviceg 
Nows-"----  WINDOWS  

Done Right. Guaranteed.' 
Window Buyer's Guide 	 

FREE COPY! VISIT www.clearchoice-usa.com/guide 

C) 

5-47 

Kevin Latimer, CPA, PC 
CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT 

935 East Main St. Phone: 254-629-8901 
Eastland, TX 76448 Fax: 254-629-8785 

.:Tax Return Preparation - Tax Planning - Payroll Processing 
Monthly Accounting - Financial Statement Compilation 

Business Organization Consulting 

Two CPA's On Staff 	5-64* 

'CALL FOR A FREE ESTIMATE! 

1325-670-0700 
1233A Tracy Lynn • Abilene • Locally Owned & Operated 

" encompas so 
H OM c 	HE A L T H 

Medicare Certified  
Home Health Services 

Skilled Nursing 

Physical Therapy 

Speech Therapy 
Occupational Therapy 

Diabetic Care 

Medical Social Work 

Home Health Aides 
Psychiatric Nursing 

420 East Main Street, Eastland, TX 76448 
866-488-8200 • 254-629-8200 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 

coP Oraphics 
a division Of boarkard 

A 	rive a fade, Save a 44 
C • • • • • • • • • • • • • 

'Gthr Cop' incr 
'Larninatin9 

"DeAign4" 
15rochures 

Gaialois 
Envelopes it Let-lesiva& 

Lops 
Nevisktters 

Vutiness Cards 

409 Old Highway 80, Olden Texas, 76466 
1-254-653-2775 

Take natli 1-20 arxess mad Turn left St CR 54o Tun left v. 0!,d !ltativray 86 to lq? 	ttiVaym 
• Behind Dave's Sibrage. 	 5-104 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 
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Maestro-Gro & AgriLIFE Extension, Texas A&M System, bring 

J-Cowarcigarrert, the "Dirt Doctor," to Tiamiiton 
Thursday, May 14 6 p.m. 

Hamilton Jr. High Cafetorium, 
400 South College 
Call (254)372-3120 

or e-mail bar-nun'htcomp.net 
2470 CR 513, Hamilton 76531 

2 IPM CEUs available on request 

TICKETS: Ads ante purchase price for 
Certified Master Gardeners: 510.00; 

$12.00 for all others. 
Add $2 to each if purchased at the door. 

Limited seating! 
Advance purchase highly recommended! 

HAMILTON COUNTY MASTER GARDNER ASSOCIATION 
Expanding the Capabilities of Texas AgriL/FE Extension Set-lice 

Extension programs of Texas AgriLife Extension Service are open to all people t%ithout regard 
to race, color, sex. disability, religion, age, or national origin. The Texas A861 Unit ersity 

System, U.S. Department of Agriculture, and the County Commissioners Courts of Texas Co- 
operating. 	 5.35 

Located behind GARY PEAK'S 
Law Office, off of Main St. 

Naoicored - pea/Jailed - c.eed 

7/ea Egiteweenteed - %or Dern 
By Appointment Only 

1181A Sewer 
Plumbing 

Or mak 

0 0 

"N 

Remodels • Repipes • Service 
M-Lic. #19120, J-Lic. #36931 

Natural Gas • LP Gas 
Residential • Commerical 

254-031-0501 325-439-13C5 
"THANK YOU EASTLAND COUNTY 

FOR ALL YOUR SUPPORT" 

JIB.: 	 IIII 
5-47 
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Mary Garner Sawyers 

COTTONWOOD-
e.nn'eth Dale Farmer, 63, 

'Saturday, May 23. 
2 00 in a local hospital. 

'Memorial services were 
held at 10 a.m. Friday, May 
1,./,'2009 at the Cross Plains 
I ire Department with Rev. 

IlifiliAcGowan officiating. 
rrangements were by 

S ta'ibuck Funeral Home. 
Kenneth was born March 

I 	1946 in Great Falls,  

Montana to Virgil Lee and 
Mary Ola (Trammel) Farmer. 
He married Norma Hale. He 
attended school in Hamlin. 
He was a Vietnam Army 
Veteran serving 3 tours of 
duty as a master sergeant 
and also serving in the Army 
Airbourne. He then became 
an army .recruiter serving in 
Wichita Falls, Abilene and 
Moses Lake, WA. He was 
a homebuilder for many  

years and a rancher who 
raised longhorn cattle. Most 
recently he was a firefighter 
in the Cottonwood Volunteer 
Fire Department. He liked to 
tinker in his workshop and 
he loved to read. He was 
a caregiver and practical 
joker. 

Survivors are his 
wife, Norma Farmer of 
Cottonwood; 	daughter, 
DeeAnn Burke and husband 
Lawson of lone. CA; 3 sons, 
Travis Northern of lone, 
CA, Kenny Farmer and wife 
Katy of Ft. Lauderdale, FL., 
Jack Farmer and wife Linda 
of Oregon; his mother, 
Mary Massey of Abilene 
2 sisters, Linda Curtis and 
husband Paul of Abilene 
and Peggy Phillips and 
husband, Danny of Bryan; 
a brother, Jimmy Massey 
and wife Terry of Tye; and 
4 grandchildren. 

Memorials may be made 
to Cottonwood Volunteer 
Control Unit do Diane 
Smith 13996 CR 461, Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443. 

Obituary 

David C. 
McCall 

CLYDE- David C. McCall, 
56, of Clyde, Texas died 
Sunday, May 31, 2009 at a 
Baird Care Center. 

Graveside services were 
held at 10 a.m. Tuesday, 
June 2, 2009 at the Dudley 
Cemetery with Pastor Chuck 
Farina officiating. Directed 
by Bailey Funeral Home of 
Clyde. 

David, a lifelong resident 
of Abilene and Clyde, was 
born April 10, 1953 in 
Abilene to L.J. and Hollis 
Edean McCall. 

Survivors are his father 
and step-mother, L.J. and 
Wanda McCall of Clyde; 
mother, Hollis Eldean Key 
of Oklahoma; aunt, Mae 
Pearl Collins of Clyde; 
several step-brothers and 
sisters, 	including 	B.J. 
Scogins of Burleson, 
Johnny Hollingsworth of 
White Settlement, David 
Barber of Mineral Wells, 
Norene Morgan of Hamlin, 
Helen Hackney of Denver 
City, and Carroll Bowman 
of Abilene, Sonny Blancet 
of Salt Lake, Utah, Calvin 
Blancet of Amarillo, Larry 
Blancet of Denver City. 

He was preceded in death 
by one brother, Jackie Dean 
McCall and step-mother. 
Dora Viola McCall. 

ABILENE- Mary 
Garner Sawyers, 75, died 
Wednesday, May 27, 2009 
at an Abilene hospital. 

A memorial service was 
held at 1:30 p.m. Friday, 
May 29, 2009 at First 
Baptist Church in Tuscola. 
Rev. Buddy Goodgame 
officiated. Private burial 
was in Elmwood Memorial 
Park, directed by Fry- 
Bartlett Funeral Home of 
Tuscola. 

Mary was born April 22, 
1934 to Granville G. and 
Edna Lucille Barr Garner 
in Spencerville, Oklahoma. 
She married Donald Wayne 
Sawyers June 4, 1954 
in Greenwood, Texas. 
She worked for Keith D. 
Graham Oil Company in 
Midland and Abilene for 
30+ years, retiring in 2003. 
She moved to Abilene from 
Midland in 2003, to Lawn 
in 2004, and returned to 
Abilene earlier this year. 
She was a member of First 
Baptist Church in Tuscola 
and frequently volunteered 

• 
• 
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• 
• 
• 
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• 
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• 

• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

• 

•  

in 	many 	charitable 
organizations in Abilene. 

She was preceded in 
death by her parents; and a 
brother. John Garner. 

Survivors are one 
daughter, Teresa Winkles 
and husband, Ken of Pecos; 
two sons, Gary Sawyers 
and wife, Vikki of Abilene 
and Don Sawyers and 
wife, Lisa of Tuscola; three 
granddaughters, Heather 
Sawyers, Halley Sawyers 
and Keirsten Benson; five 
grandsons, K. W. Winkles, 
Kyle Winkles, Casey 
Benson, Ryder Sawyers, 
and Michael Luvaul and 

Cross Plains 	 4th Block E. of 

254-725-7361 BI RITE AUTO Light, Hwy 36 

325-669-0999 	 WE FINANCE 
OPEN MON.-SAT. 9:00 - 5:30 CLOSED SUN. 

AUTOMOBILES 
01 Lincoln LS V8, fully loaded, looks, runs very good, leather, moon roof 	$6450 
00 Mercury Mystique 4 cyl., looks, runs good - red 	 $2750 
02 Mercury Sable V6, nice car, white 	 $4150 
02 TaurusSES Fully Loaded, power seats, etc., black 	 $4295 
98 Ford Contour, V6 runs good, green 	 SPECIAL $2250 
95 Mercury Cougar XR7, V6. very nice car 	 $2450 
94 Mercury Cougar XR7, 4.6 V8, a good car inside & out, gold 	 $2450 
99 Ford Taurus V6. looks, runs good, silver 	 $2950 

.94 Chevy Caprice, a good buy at. 	 $1850 
93 Mercury Cougar XR7, runs very good, green 	 .Reduced to $1250 
91 Buick LaSabre, looks, runs very good, white 	 $1695 
99 Ford T-Bird V6, looks, runs good 	 $2650 
94 Honda Accord 4 cyl., 5 sp., good on fuel, runs good 	 $2850 

VANS -SINS 
00 Ford Explorer, V6, auto., 4 dr.. very nice, red, SPECIAL 	 $5250 
97 Ford Explorer XLT Fully loaded and nice, black 	 SPECIAL $3750 
97 Ford Explorer V6, auto., looks, runs good, white 	 $3495 
90 Ford Bonco V6, very nice inside & out, runs good 	 $2450 
98 Ford Windstar, V6, 3 seats, looks, runs good - maroon 	 $2750 
97 Ford Aerostar XLT, V6. a very nice van - green 	 $2150 
96 Windstar GL. V6, 3 seats, very nice van in & out, silver 	 $2650 

1)1FSELS 
00 Ford XLT Diesel Crew Cab. 6 sp.. a nice truck, silver 	 $6850 
98 Dodge Cummins Dually flatbed, 183k. runs very good 	 $5500 
01 Ford F350 Super Duty Power Stroke, crew cab, 6 sp 	 $6250 
99 F250 XLT 4x4, Crew Cab, power stroke, 6 sp., super duty, very nice 	$6950 
01 Ford F250 XLT. Super Duty, 4 dr., Super Cab, 6 sp 	 $6750 
99 Ford F350 Crew Cab, Super Duty, 6 sp 	 $6250 
99 Ford F250 Super Duty, 4 dr., Super Cab, 6 sp.. Power Stroke 	 $5950 
97 Ford F250 Heavy Duty Super Cab, Power Stroke 	 SPECIAL $4250 
95 Ford F250 Power Stroke, Super Cab, 5 sp., runs good 	 $3995 
94 Ford F350 Crew Cab, Turbo Diesel, a nice truck 	 SPECIAL $3950 
90 Ford Turbo Diesel 4x4 Dually flatbed, a good work truck, red 	 $3250 
94 Chevy Diesel Crew Cab, auto, runs good, paint bad 	 $1995 
95 Ford F350 Crew Cab Dually, Power Stroke, automatic, red 	 $3500 

PAS TRUCKS-MISC, 
04 Tandem Gooseneck 2 car hauler in very good condition 	 $5250 
00 Ranger XLT Super Cab, V6, auto., a very good truck, blue 	SPECIAL $4850 
02 Ford Ranger XLT Super Cab. V6.5 sp., looks, runs good 	SPECIAL $5450 
99 Ford Ranger Super Cab, new V6 w/90 day warranty, a good buy at 	SPECIAL $4850 
98 Chevy S-10, 4 cyl., auto., looks, runs good, green 	REDUCED TO $3650 
97 Ford F250 Crew Cab. V8, auto., a super nice truck, white 	SPECIAL $3995 
83 Chevy 3/4 Ton 454 V8, a very clean nice pickup, white 	 $1595 
85 Ford4x4F250,Wrecker Truck, everything works good 	 $1995 
97 Ford Super Cab, F150, V8, 5 sp., looks, runs very good, tan 	 $2750 
96 Chevy S-10, 4 cyl., 5 sp., very nice :ruck, tan 	 $3500 
94 Fokt F250 with utility boxlied. alood truck and good buy ' 	• " 	 $1995 

. 	• 	„ 	 - 	• 

Thursday. June 4, 2009 

wife, Mandy; three brothers. 
Everett Leon Garner and 
Alton Garner both of Frisco. 
and Gene Garner of Clyde: 
several nieces, nephews. and 
other relatives: and many 
friends. 

Evelyn R. 
Scott 

CLYDE- Evelyn R. Scott. 
83, died Tuesday, June 2, 
2009 at a local hospital. 

Services will be at 2 p.m. 
Thursday, June 4, 2009 at 
Hwy 36 Church of Christ. 

Visitation was held from 
6-8 p.m. Wednesday at the 
funeral home. 



EASTLAND 
MEMORIAL HOSPITAL 

20Q9 ANNUAL 
CHARITY 

GOLF TOURNAMENT 

Saturday June 20th 
at Lakeside Golf Course in Eastland 

Four-person Scramble 
Bring your own team or be placed on a team 

Cash Prizes 
100% Payback 

-AlLproceeds will go to the EN4,friNvIttnteeT,Ppoim and 'be designated - 
for purchases needed Tor your local healthcare at 

Eastland Memorial Hospital 

• Entry Fee - $65.00 per person 
(Includes green fee and meal) 

• Carts $12.00 for 1/2 

`)= Mulligans $5.00 each - Limit 3 

All entries must be in before noon on Friday, June 191h. 

For more inforfflation please contact: 
Leisha Hodges at 254-631-5368 or email leish.a.hodaesrdembd.grz, 

Nancy Hanis at 254-629-1027, or Vicki Smith at 254-647-5247 

EASTLAND 
MEMORIAL HOSPITAL  

"People You Know Caring for People You Love" 

A-QUALITY WELDING „ 
& STEEL SUPPLY 

'7 at METAL BUILDINGS • STRUCTURAL STEEL 
••- 1-.). FABRICATION • BUILDING COMPONENT 

.WELDING SUPPLIES & GASES 
Metz Blsdg Cleararke Sale Call. Now 
700 East 1-20 Cisco, TX 

(254) 4424036 
Check out out prices updated dally 	VA vw.aqualltysteel. oat 

Ilan Motors Used Can 
"Serving Cisco Since 1979" 

800 West Interstate 20 • Cisco, Texas 
(254) 442-4262 • (817)-999-5272 

1994 Chevy Corsica 4 dr., auto, air, fully loaded, 61k. like new..$2950 
2002 Saturn 4 dr., 57k, fully loaded, extra nice 	 $5500 
2003 Mazda B2300: ext. cab, 6 cyl., 5 sp., fully loaded 	 $4950 
2005 Ford Taurus: 4 dr., loaded, 72k 	  $4950 
2005 Ford FI50 Longbed: auto, air, 72k 	  $6995 
2005 Chevy Aveo: LT 4-dr, auto, air, 39k. 	  $6350 
2006 Ford F350 16 ft. moving van, loaded 	  $8950 

US. GOVT. CARS 
2 - 05 Chevy Malibu Classics, loaded, 52k miles 	 $5995 
2004 Chevy Venture Van, Ext., loaded, 70Ic 	  $6500 

te--66 - 4za Mere Gm b Chem, Pram 

ABILENE- Thomas Lee 
Groom, 28, of Abilene, died 
May 27, 2009 at his home. 
Services were held Sunday, 

May 31, 2009 at 2 p.m. 
at Piersall Chapel. Burial 
was in the new Veteran's 
Cemetery in Abilene at 10 
a.m. Tuesday, June 2. 

Thomas was born October 
8, 1980 in Hillsdale, 
Michigan to William Groom 
and Cherrie Bolenbaugh. He 
graduated from high school 
in Gaylesville, Alabama 
and immediately joined the 
service. He decided to join 
the United States Air Force 
and took college courses 
while he served. He loved 
to work on his truck and 
enjoyed four wheeling. He 
also enjoyed collecting and 
shooting guns as a hobby. 
During his time in the Air 
Force he worked on the B-1 
bomber. 

He has lived in Abilene 
since 2000 and was 
honorably 	discharged 
from the service in 2006. 
During the time he served 
his country he received the 
National Defense Service 
Medal, Air Force Longevity 
Service Award, Global War 
on Terrorism Service Medal 

Baird Market 
Daze Sign-Ups 
Underway 

All local vendors, indi-
viduals and organizations 
interested in participating in 
the annual Market Daze in. 
downtown Baird are asked 
to contact the Chamber of 
Commerce. 

Plans for the Saturday, 
June 27th event sponsored 
by the Chamber are coming 
together as the Chamber 
board and Museum work-
ers tie up loose ends for 
the usual activities as well 
as some special projects. 
New events are expected 
to attract a large crowd this 
year. More detials will be 
announced in the coming 
weeks. 

Space should be reserved 
as soon as possible. Booth 
fees are $20.00 for 10 x 10 
space and $30.00 for a 10 x 
20 space. 

Call the Baird Chamber 
at 854-2003, or come by the 
office at the T & P Depot. 

Caiman Cegint'y 

talfcl Star 

cleacitinej 

y 5:6® ~.,~.  

Toqclay4 

and the Air Force Training 
Ribbon. Since his discharge 
from the Air Force, Thomas 
has been working for Coca-
Cola as a mechanic. He 
truly enjoyed the friends he 
made there. 

Thomas was preceded in 
death by his father, William 
Thomas Groom. 

Survivors are his 
mother, Cherrie Ferguson 
Bolenbaugh of Clyde; 
one 	brother, 	Chad 
Bolenbaugh of Alabama; 
grandmothers, Mary Smith 
of Hillsdale, Michigan 
and Norma Belknap of 
Moscow, Michigan; also 
many extended family and 
friends. 

Luck Wayne (L.W.) Mitch-
ell, Jr., 88. of Cross Plains 
died Sunday, May 31, 2009 
at Songbird Nursing Home 
in Brownwood. 

Funeral services will he 
at 2 p.m. Thursday, June 4. 
2009 at Higginbotham Cha-
pel in Cross Plains with Rex 
Beggs officiating, assisted 
by Ronnie B. White. Burial 
will follow in the Eastland 
Cemetery in Eastland. 

He was born May 25, 
1921 in Tolar, Texas to L.W. 
Mitchell, Sr. and wife Ida 
C. (Collins) Mitchell. He 
married Jeanne Juncker on 
June 9, 1967 in Lafayet, CO. 
She preceded him in death 
on January 11, 2008. L.W. 
served in the U.S. Navy and 
mentioned numerous times 
of how proud he was to have 

served his couAtry. He was 
a member of the First Bap-
tist Church of Cross Plains. 

He is survived by his son. 
Cliff Mitchell of TN: daugh-
ter, Linda: step-daughter. 
Maonique Graham of CO: 
sister, Betty Jo Scott of Ft. 
Worth; a grandson and two 
step-grandsons; as well as 
numerous nieces and neph-
ews. 

He was preceded in death 
by his parents, wife, three 
brothers, Milburn, Evan 
and Roy Mitchell; two sis-
ters, Gracie Moore and Di-
xie Pontremoli. 

Family and friends arc in= 
vited to a time of visitation 
and the sharing of memories 
at Higginbotham Funeral 
Home on Wednesday, June 
3 from 5:30 to 6:30 p.m. 

Thursday, June 4, 2009 

Luck Wayne (L.W.) Mitchell, Jr. 

ecn 
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"Go With The Best" 

* TRI-STAR * 
HOME CARE 

"Gives Quality Care" 

* Home Health Care 
* Primary Care 

* C.B.A. 

Cisco, TX 76437 
Telephone (254) 442-4996 

Obituaries 
Thomas Lee Groom 
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Callahan County Baird Star 

Remember to renew your 
subscription 

In County $17.00 1 Year 

 

Guaranteed 

  

 

oofing & Construction 
Licensed, Bonded and Insured For Your Protection 

Let our knowledgeable staff assist you with Free 
Inspection and assistance with insurance claim 

For a limited time Guaranteed Roofing & 
Construction will be offering a free upgrade 

to a 26 ga. steel roof whenwe work 
with your insurance company 

• Impact Resistant 
• Fire Resistant 

May qualify for premium discount 
with your insurance company* 

*Some resistrictions may apply 

 

 

• • 
	866-582-ROOF (16631 

  

 

• 

    

      

      

      

You Don't Have To Spend 
All Your Lifes Savings On Nursing Home Cost! 

=IR 
II 
I 

IIII 

- 	I 

1  

■ Nursing home financial planning, for individuals in a 
. nursing home who are seeking the preservation of their 

assets from total spend down at a nursing home. 

II Preservation of assets for individuals who are not yet in 
nursing homes. 

■ 

venbr.Acld es m 	

oi Elderk 	Attorneys Staff i r- 
dudes professional 

advisorsa r
f
,ersenecicaid 

 case workers with over 50 years of combined experi-
ence dealing specifically with nursing home Medicaid 

LADY MAN 	eligibility Arming. 
LAW OFFICE 
FOR SENIOR 	- 	

www.ladymanseniorplanning.com 

PLANNING 	 325-676-5775 
800-676-5775 

SERVICES 	500 Chestnut. Ste 1701 • Abilene, TX 79602 	547 

Heart of Texas 
Internal Medicine OneSource 

HEALTH CENTER Associates, P.A. 	Rising Star 
Dr. JoAnne Paulk 

902 West College Street • Rising Star, TX 76471 

254-643-3141 
Open: Monday-Friday 8am-Spm 

Walk In Clinic 
Accepts All Major Insurance including Star Medicaid 

CROSSWORD PUZZLE 
1 2 3 4 5 	6 7 8 10 

11 12 ■ 13 

14 15 16 ■ 17 

18 19 20 21 22 ■ 

23 24 25 

26 27 	28 

29 30 

31 3? 33 34 35 

36 ■ 37 38 

39 ■ 41 42 43 

44 45 48 

47 48 49 

50 51 52 53 	54 55 

57 ■ 58 59 
. 

60 61 I ■ 

62 63 

CLUES ACROSS 	 8. Execute or perform 
I. 	s: sunflower state 	 9. Atomic number 13 
6. Taro roots 	 10. Parry 

I I. John Voight's daughter 	 I I. United 	_ Emirates 
14. Women's undergarment 	 12. Atomic #28 
15. Islamic commanders 	 13. Copyread 
16. Tooth caregiver 	 14. Prior to year 1 
18. Undermined & fallen 	 17. A large quantity 
21. Monounsaturated fatty acid 	19. Take in solid food 
23. 	y and the Beast 	 20. A pair of singers 
25. Spanish nap 	 21. Strongyl 	sis: nematode disease 
26. Greek porticos 	 22. Pencil carbons 
28. Modernized 	 24. Follows sigma 
29. Reproached severely 	 25. A fashionable hotel 
31. Careless 	 27. Eyeglasses 
34. One point S of due E 	 28. Brown bears 
35. Cleopatra's killer 	 30. Abbr. for oil container 
36. The Copacabana for one 	 • 31. Floor covering 
39. Tropical fruits 	 32. Texas team member 
40. Wise men 	 33. Bantu tribe 
44. A self-centered person 	 36. 4th largest Japanese city 
45. An exact counterpart 	 37. Vietnamese offensive 
47. European sole genus 	 38. 	boo:, Panda food 
48. Shallow water 	 39. Steeply edged tableland 
50. Yes vote 	 41. Auto fuel 
51. Archaic spoke 	 42, _ical: moral 
56. Ultrahigh frequency 	 43. Abrasive cleanings 
57. "Charade" actress 	 46. Bakker's downfall 
61. Polite address to a woman 	 49. Low frequency 
63. Directions (Scottish) 	 51. A very large body of water 
CLUES DOWN 	 52. British statesman (1584-1643) John 

I. Jacks in the deck 	 53. Exclamation of surprise 
2. Silver 	 54. I_: Swedish store 
3. Point midway bemeen N and E 	55. Indicates near 
4. Patts Hearst's captoN 	 58. Algerian dinar 
5. Point a weapon 	 59. Rural delivery 
6. Pinna 	 60. Atomic #35 
". Disc jocke> s 	 61. Western state 

This puzzle sponsored by 	• 

Et 	
. RON.q 

P. 0. Box 877 Eastland, TX 76448 



/gcli) (Nett cifikte 

106 W. Commerce 
Eastland, TX 76448 

254-629-8896' 
Fax 254-629-1426 

Paul W. Lewallen 

George Willoughby 
254-631-8605 

5-43 	 (mobile) 

Send us any news you would 
like to be printed. 

Send to: Callahan/Eastland County 
Newspapers P.O. Box 29 Eastland, TX 

76448 or email ecn@att.net or 
fax 254-629-2092 

S 14:12>OKAA. 
1 2 6 9 

2 7 3 4 
8 6 3 5 2 

3 7 9 6 
5 4 6 3 1 

6 2 5 8 
7 5 

9 2 7 3 
3 5 2 1 

Here's How It Works: 
Sudoku puzzles are formatted as a 9x9 grid, broken down 
into nine 3x3 boxes. To solve a sudoku, the numbers 1 
through 9 must fill each row, column and box. Each num-
ber can appear only once in each row, column and box. 
You can figure out the order in which the numbers will 
appear by using the numeric clues already provided in the 
boxes. The more numbers you name, the easier it gets to 
solve the puzzle! 

We Clean The Most Neglected, 
Unsanitary Part Of Your Home: 

YOUR AIR DUCT SYSTEM!  
J & J Air Conditioning, Inc. 

106 Pogue Eastland, TX 
254-629-2251 TACLB00200C 800-585-2251 
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Bobby Liles At Gospel Meek Blood Center Scranton Homecoming 
Mission June 7th 	Blood Drive June 9 	Musical To Be Saturday 

Bobby Liles will be the 
guest at Gospel Mission, 
716 S.E. I st Street, Cross 
Plains on Sunday, June 7th 
at 10 a.m. 

Bobby and his wife, 
Laqueta, 	served 	as 
missionaries in Africa. 

Bobby has also preached on 
television. The couple now 
reside in Baird. 

Everyone is cordially 
invited to attend this special 
service according to Pastor 
Michael Ingram. 

The annual Scranton 
homecoming 	musical 
will follow homecoming 
activities on Saturday, June 
6. All activities will be held 
at the community center. 
There will be a bar-b-que 
dinner beginning at 5:30. 
The music will begin at 6:00. 

This is our only fund raiser 
for the year. All proceeds 
go to keep the community 
center 	operating. 	We 
welcome all area musicians 
to play. You may call 325-
692-2057 to reserve a time 
for your group. Mark Ray is 
the emcee. 

Fax its with your news: 254-629-2092 Putnam Reunion Saturday 

Right at time moment, 
physicians are ordering 
blood for patients who 
need lifesaving blood 
transfusions. Meek Blood 
Center in Abilene supplies 
all of the blood used for 
patient care at fifteen area 
hospitals in a twelve county 
area. 

Local residents will have 
the opportunity to roll up 
their sleeves and help save 
a life on Tuesday, June 9. 
The Meek Blood Center 
blood mobile will be parked 
at First Baptist Church in 
Cross Plains from noon until 
6 p.m. 

"Most of us would be 
willing to give up an hour 
of our time to save a life," 
said Frances Baker, donor 

Master of Cermonies will 
be Bobby Isenhower from 
Tyler Texas. 

Come visit and fellowship 
with old friends and class-
mates. 

QUESTIONS MAY BE 
DIRECTED TO 325-662-
3334. 

Putnam will host a school 
reunion on June 6, 2009. 

Refreshments and visiting 
will begin at 9:00AM at the 
old school building. 

Lunch will be served at 
11:30AM. 

A short business meeting 
will begin at 1:00PM. 

recruiter for Meek Blood 
Center. "The patients who 
are on the receiving end of 
this precious gift of life are 
very grateful to those who 
are willing to take the time 
to go through the donation 
process." 

Donors must be at least 
17 years old, weigh a 
minimum of 120 pounds 
and be in goad health. Each 
donor must present a photo 
ID. Most medications do 
not interfere with donor 
eligibility. Those who have 
eligibility questions may 
call Meek Blood Center at 
325-670-2798 or visit www. 
meekbloodcenter.org. 

Each donor will receive a 
free health screening, total 
cholesterol test and a T-
shirt. 

Callahan County Baird Star 
P.O. Box 29 

Eastland, TX 76448 Remember to renew 
your subscription NOTICE 

Opinions expressed in articles and letters submitted by others do not 
necessarily reflect the opinions or beliefs of the Owners, Managers, 
and Staff of Eastland County Newspapers, Inc. 

* * * 
Letters to the Editor: All letters must be signed with name and phone 
number on the letter. If it is requested "name withheld" when someone 
asks we will give out the name of the person who wrote the letter, so 
they must be signed or the letter will not be printed. 

* * * 
Errors and ommissions will be corrected to the extent of the specific 
error or omission in the next edition when called to the attention of 
the newspaper or publisher. 

* * * 
Attention: All Advertisers 
This newspaper is not responsible for errors or omissions printed in 
error, except to correct them in the next edition. It is the responsibility 
of the advertiser to notify this newspaper after the first appearance. 
Transfer of ownership of an advertised business and/or service does 
nut alleviate the responsibility for payments of this obligation. 
A on,: and one half ( 1 & 1/2) percent interest will be added monthly 
to bills after 30 days in arrears. 
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THE CARE YOU NEED. 
WHEN YOU NEED IT. 

Chiropractic, Medical 
and Physical Therapy 
ALL-IN-ONE Clinic. 
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* * * 
Responsibility and Liability: The Eastland County Newspapers 
assumes no obligation, responsibility or liability for subject matter 
contained in copy placed by advertisers or their agents. The advertiser 
agrees that all materials and copy will comply with applicable state 
and federal laws and regulations. It is also understood the advertiser 
and/or his agents jointly and separately agree to indemnify the publisher 
and the newspaper against all expenses, loss or damage incurred or 
sustained by reason of printing such copy. All advertising copy sub- 
mitted is subject to approval, revision or rejection by the publisher. 
To be binding upon the Eastland County Newspapers all instructions 
relative to the advertisement must be in written form. The Eastland 
County Newspapers is not bound by any terms or conditions, printed 
or otherwise, appearing on order blanks, advertising forms, or copy 
instructions, when the same is in conflict with terms and conditions of 
the newspapers rate card or policies. The publisher reserves the right to 
edit or reject advertisements deemed objectionable, illegal or of poor 
reproduction quality, or because of conditions beyond the newspapers 
control. All advertising must be on behalf of the advertiser's business 
or service exclusively. The Eastland County Newspapers reserves the 
right to insert the word Advertisement above all ads, including all copy 
ads which might be mistaken for news articles. 

* * * 
Public-Legal Notice Advertising: Rates for any public or legal notice 
or advertisement required by federal, state or local law or court order 
are in accordance with Texas Revised Statutes. Rates are based upon 
a 11.5 point typeset lines on a column width of 11.5 picas. Rate: 150 
per word, per paper, per time. 

Family Health, including 
• Colds & Flu 
• Hypertension & Diabetes 
• Well Child Check-ups & 

Immunizations 
• Well Men & Women Exams 

Ann Williams Real Estate 
WILLIAMS RANCH PROPERTIES 

601 Conrad Hilton Cisco 	254-442-1880 	www.amtwilliamsrealestate.com 

We serve Patients of all ages. 

Digital X-Ray On-Site. 

New! Digital Motion X-Ray. 

DRX9000 Spinal Decompression. 

Arch Support Orthotics 
Digital Scanner. 

Physical Examinations 
• Sports & Camps 
• DOT & Non-DOT 
• Pre-Employment 

Urgent Injury & Illness 
• Accidents 
• Sprains & Strains 
• Fractures 
• Cuts & Burns 
• Earaches & Asthma 

We accept Medicare, 
Medicaid, BCBS and Most 
Healthcare Insurances. 

Most major credit cards are 
accepted. 

New Patients Accepted. 

CALL NOW FOR 

Occupational Health 
• Workers' Comp Injury 

TWCC Designated Doctor 

• Drug Screening 

Sports Injuries 

Neck & Back Disorders 

APPOINTMENT u !In 

Bone, Joint & Muscular 
Disorder 

Phone: (254) 442-4878 
Chiropractic: M T W F 8:30 — 5:00 
Medical: Monday — Friday 8:00 — 5:00 
Physical Therapy: Mon .& Wed 8 — 5 

Tues, Thurs & Fri 8 -- 3 

PLEXUS Balance & Gait 
Disorders 

344 Acres on Leon River -Eastland Co- mostly wooded with 
a large portion of big pecan tree bottoms, live oak & post oak 
trees too, several very large hills with great views, 4 different 
creeks & the Leon River runs through the property, 1 lake, 3 
ponds, various wetland areas, lots of water, barn, water well, 
good fishing & lots of wildlife including deer, turkey, hogs, dove, 
duck, quail. $2,500 per acre. 
445 Acres High Fence on Leon River, 200"+ genetics, nice 3 
BR 2 bath home, garage, lar•e shop, 5-years under high fence 
deer management , exotics, large hills 
& canyons, most! 	SOLD 	post oak, creek, 1 
lake, 7 ponds, food plots, protein feeders, stands, corn feeders, 
observatory tower, Eastland Co. $1,595,000. 
640 Acres -Callahan Co- completely wooded with several very 
large hill ridges & canyons with views for miles, 7 ponds with 
several being very large, mostly live oak & mesquite, creeks, 
140 feet of elevation change, good road frontage, close to 
Eastland Co. line, wildlife includes deer, turkey, hogs, dove, 
duck, & quail $2,100 per acre 

HOMES 
3 BR, 1 bath, home with CH/A, within last year carpet and ceramic 
floor tile was installed. Garage, carport, corner property, backyard 
fenced. $49,500. 
3 BR, 1 3/4 bath brick home with CH, woodbuming fireplace, 
gameroom, fenced backyard. Reduced to $52,000. 
3BR, 2 bath home 	SOLD. 	, some wood floors, 
double carport, wo 
3 BR, 2 bath home with CH/A, large den, dining, kitchen 
combination, separate LR, large master BR with 2 closets, carport 
replaced, double gara • e, 2 lots, $66,500. 
3 BR, 1 3/4 bath brie .  1• II  • • 1  . 	builtins, attached 2 
vehicle garage with o 	SOL 	ch, storage building, 
fenced   R

bath
back 

home, 
$ersZ 3B  

wood floors, detached 2 vehicle garage, 
shop, storage bldg., barn on approx. 18 acres, $87,000. 
4 BR '1314 bath, brick home, CH/A, large LR, separate OR, storm 
windOws, storm cellar, covered patio, large storage bldg., 2 vehicle 
carport. fenced backyard. $89.500. 
RECENTLY BUILT 3BR, 2 bath home with CH/A, double pane 
windows, workshop, double carport, approx. 2 acres, $90,000. 
On 2 acres, fenced and crosslenced, 3 BR, 1 1/2 bath home, CH/A, 
DR plus breakfast 	- 
roof, surrounded • SOLD 	,s, metal siding, metal 

Reduced to $99,500. - 	
, storage bldg., barn, 

Large 4 BR, 1 3/4 bath brick home with CH/A, LR and den, 
WBFP in den, big utility room, many large closets, storm windows 
attached 2 vehicle garage, patio, storage bldg.. fenced backyard. 
$112,000. 
4 BR, 21/2 bath brick home with CH/A (re lacedinn 20071. WBFP 
nice carpet, laminate 

. 	
e carport, detached 

garage or shop, co  
Great View of Lake and Golf Course from balcony, 3 BR, 2 bath 
home with 2 family rooms central air ana heat. WBFP, covered 
balcony, drive thru 2 vehicle carport. storage blags . patio, many 
large oak trees. on approx. 1/2 acre 
1576 Acres with large 2 BR, 1 314 bath home CH/A, eating bar 
between kitchen and LR, sunroom and deck off kitchen large 
gameroom could be used for 3rd BR patio double carport. large 
storage bldg., large shop. Home built around 1999 with metal 
beam framing 
Lots of Character - Wonderful 6 BR. 2 full 314 and 1/2 baths 2 
story home with DR. LR breakfast rook. aen with WBFP large 
kitchen, utility room: balcony 2 01-/A units. 2 vehicle garage storage 
building. 3 lots. fenced backyard 

MERCIAL 
Commercial property that fronts on Interstate 20 shop small 
office budding. 2 large carports. previously used for inventory sales. 
$72,500. Call for details.  

ACREAGE 
31.32 Acres - Eastland Co- wooded mostly with oak trees, 
several large hills with views down to canyons & a creek, 
paved road frontage, very nice property, deer, turkey, hogs, 
dove, duck, quail, $77,000. 
32 Acres -Eastland Co- small pecan orchard, mostly open 
with some scattered trees, rolling hill with View, close to water 
line, excellent home site, deer, turkey, dove, quail $2,225 
per acre. 
33 Acres -Eastland Co- Adjoining Lake Cisco, wooded mostly 
with live oak trees, very large hill with view perfect for .home 
site, water well, deer, turkey, hogs, dove, quail, $99,900 
45.75 Acres -Eastland Co- mobile home, water well, mostly 
wooded with oaks, one field ideal for wildlife, small tractor, 
shredder, blinds & feeders, deer, turkey, hogs, dove, & quail 
$114,000 
48+/- Acres -Eastland Co- mostly wooded with oaks, small 
field ideal for wildlife, great recreation or home site, pave road 
frontage, deer, turkey, hogs, dove, & quail. $105,360 
60 Acres -Eastland Co- Wooded & open with fields, large 
hill with view, pond, electricity, joins large ranches, wildlife 
includes deer, turkey, hogs, dove, duck, quail $1,900 per 
acre 
65.43 Acres -Eastland Co- wooded with oaks, large hill with 
great view, paved road frontage, deer, turkey, hogs, dove, 
quail $148,000 
65.498 Acres -Eastland o- mobile home, wooded with 
oaks, two large hill 	 ater well, paved 
road frontage, deer, ur ey, ogs, ove, quail $156,000 
6644- Acres -Eastland Co- mostly wooded with oaks, small 
field ideal for wildlife, pond, water well, rolling hill with view, 
home site potential, pave road frontage, deer, turkey, hogs, 
dove, & quail. $144,870 
75 Acres -Eastland Co- Mixed wooded with oaks & various 
fields, metal barn, 3 ponds, water line, livestock pens, lots of 
cross fencing, deer, turkey, hogs, dove, duck, quail $156,000 
91 Acres - Eastlan 	i 	' h oak trees, large 
hills, creek, deer, to 	 il. $198,000. 
114 Acres - Eastland Co- mostly wooded with mature oak 
trees, several smaller fields, hill down to creek bottom, water 
well, pond, paved road frontage, wildlife includes deer, turkey, 
hogs, dove, duck, quail. $250,000 
116 Acres on Sabana River-Eastland Co- mostly wooded 
with oak & elm trees, Sabana River runs through the property, 
pond, 2 fields, camper, deer, turkey, hogs, dove, duck, & quail. 
$244,000 
148 Acres - Eastland Co- wooded mostly with oak trees, very 
large hill with viewgiflgns, creek. pond, 
paved road frontag1.11,1Waliallrillter, turkey, hogs. 
dove, duck, quail, $2,175 per acre. 
155 Acres - Callahan Co. - mostly wooded with oaks & 
mesquites, three Issistensflail- 	is, large hills & 
canyons, paved roallINIIWJAW41.1111Songside property, 
deer, turkey, hogs, duck, quail $279,000 
160 Acres -Eastland Co- very large hills and canyons. mostly 
wooaed with red oak & live oak trees, creek. 1-large pond, 
1-average pond, 1-field, great views for miles, deer, turkey, 
hogs, dove. duck, & quail. $344,000 
164 Acres -Callahan Co- mostly wooded with live oak & 
mesquite trees, several hills with views, creek, 2 ponds, 
remote & joins large ranches, deer, turkey, hogs, dove, duck, 
& quail S1.890 per acre. 
208 Acres - Eastland Co- wooded & open, oak & mesquite 
trees. two ponds. food plots, county road frontage. wildlife 
includes deer. turke dove. duck. & quail. $1,870 per acre. 
241 Acres - woode• w1 h 	• 	mst oak, live oak, 2 
creeks. 2 ponds. p. 	SOLI) 	t views & loaded 
with wildlife $524.0 

Healthcare Center Physical Therapy 
w ith Aquatics 

Dr. Devin Koenig, D.C. 
Jeff Davis, PT 

1510 State Hwy 206 
Cisco, Texas 76437 

Dr. Cynthia McNeely, M.D. 
Sally Griewahn, DRPH, FNP 

Broker Ann J. Williams, LLC Jimmy Williams 
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