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‘Ore again, o ff again9 car wash 
heading for court Thursday
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MRS. MINNIE SKINNER coocen 
trates her efforts on blowing the 
biggest bubble during the Friendly 
Door s bubble gum blowing contest 
recently. She was the unanimous 
winner.

There’s good news and bad news 
for the owners of the proposed new 
car wash on West Highway.

The good news is that the board of 
adjustments granted variances on 
setback and fence requirements and 
instructed the city administrator to 
issue a new zoning clearance permit 
and building permit.

The bad news is that the 
developers have been issued a 
temporary restraining order through 
district judge Temple Driver, and 
nothing can be done on the project

until a hearing is held next Thursday 
in 78th district court.

Action by the board of adjustments 
was taken Friday evening. The 
developers presented a request for 
zoning permit clearance Monday, and 
it was approved. Tuesday morning 
the original building permit fee was 
refunded, and a new building permit 
was issued and new fee paid, 
according to Steve Morath, city 
administrator.

Then, shortly after noon Tuesday, 
the court order was served on the city

and each of the developers, Mike 
Longley, Gary D. Snow, Teddy G. 
Tomerlin and Ronnie Lee Wilson.

Petitioners for the judicial review 
and temporary restraining order 
were James M. Morris, Kenneth 
Garrett and Sue Garrett.

The restraining order prohibits the 
developers from doing any work or 
purchasing any supplies, materials or 
equipment for use in the construction 
or operation of the car wash.

The petition alleges there were not 
four votes cast when the board of 
variances acted on the variances, that 
incorrect basis was cited for the 
variances, that no evidence was 
presented before the hearing by the 
developers, that hardship of the 
developers was self imposed and that 
the plaintifs were not provided a due 
process for appealing the permit.

Only four members of the board 
were present Friday night. David 
Padgett was absent, due to a conflict 
with his vacation. Those attending 
included Donald Hill, chairman, Rip 
Smith, John Brown and Charlie Lee.

Four votes are required for any

action to be approved by the board, 
and the plaintiffs allege that Hill did 
not cast votes during the meeting. 
Hill did instruct the minutes to reflect 
each motion passed, however.

At the outset of Friday’s meeting, 
Morris was asked to make his 
presentation, and he did for some 48 
minutes. Then Mike Longley was 
asked to give his side and he said he 
had no statement to make but would 
answer questions.

Board members voted to grant 
variances on the front, back and side 
setback requirements, and also 
the fencing requirement.

The front setback variance was 
said to be 21 feet six inches, but 
Morris disputed the measurement 
and said he measured 16 feet from the 
property line. The back setback was 
approved for 24 feet and the side, 
which adjoins another tract of land 
owned by the developers, to five feet.

Board members cited traffic safety 
as their reason for granting a 
variance from fencing the north side 
of the property, along Alameda, 
where vehicles will be exiting from

the car wash.
Members were not certain the 

fencing was actually required, but 
took the action in case it was, they 
said.

The district court hearing next 
Thursday is to be held at 11:30.

Fund established 
to assist Watts

A fund to financially assist the 
Kenneth Watts family has been 
established at State National Bank.

Mrs. (Robbie) Watts, a rural mail 
carrier who suffered a hemmorhage 
in the brain about a month ago, 
remains in the intensive care unit of 
Parkland Hospital in Dallas.

She, was scheduled for surgery 
early this week, but the action was 
delayed due to complications, 
according to a close friend.

Deposits can be made to the Robbie 
Watts Special Fund.

City to fight phone rate
The Iowa Park city council 

Monday evening joined with the 
Texas Municipal League in opposing 
the rate increase sought by 
SouihwmUm iwu T»Uphune, and 
changed their auditors.

With several members citing 
problems caused by service, or lack of 
service, by the telephone company, 
aldermen unanimously agreed to join 
the TML in fighting the rate increase 
to be heard by the Texas Municipal 
League.

Mayor Johnny Crawford summed 
the feelings of the council when he 
said “I think the PUC needs to be 
aware of our problems, and I plan to 
take them (the problems) to the PUC 
if there is no other way.”

Acting on the recommendation of 
city administrator Steve Morath, 
council members approved changing 
of auditors. The new auditing firm 
will be Baines and Stringer of Dallas, 
which has audited municipal financial 
records for several cities, including 
Electra, for a number of years.

Though the total cost could not be 
discussed, due to “ethics" set by the 
state auditors’ organization, a fee of 
$75 per hour was offered and an 
estimated 80 hours of work was 
mentioned.

The audits performed by a Wichita 
Falls firm have been increasing in 
cost, to approximately $16,000. and 
complaints have been voiced both 
about the cost and the format of the 
printed audit in recent years.

Several committee appointments 
proposed by Crawford were approved 
by council members. David Pace was 
named to replace L.S. Whisnand and 
George Hammonds Tor James 
Whitaker on the planning and zoning 
committee; Delbert Todd and Jim 
Alsup reappointed to the parks 
commission; Robert Cole and Jerald 
Walsh were reappointed to the traffic 
safety council.

Aldermen approved the only bid 
submitted for grazing rights at Lake 
Iowa Park. Dr. Thurman Reitz 
proposed a lease of $8.05 per acre.

Also approved, after a 35-minute 
executive session, was the hiring of a 
new police officer, Dale Leslie 
Washburn.

The resident of 413 Valley Drive, 
Washburn, 23, is a graduate of 
Texoma Regional Police Academy, 
receiving his basic certification. His 
work experience has been a police 
officer at Van Alstyne, sheriffs

deputy at Grayson County, and police 
officer at Howe and Whitesboro. He 
remained at the Grayson County
position the longMt. on® yt>mr.

During a discussion concerning a 
fire substation in the south side of the 
city, a question was posed as to how 
many firemen live and work during 
the day in that area who could 
respond to a fire call.

The sub station has been proposed 
in case a fire call was received from 
the south side of town, and units from 
the station on the north side could not 
reach it when a long coal train might 
be passing through the city.

A study of the past 18 months 
indicated 12 of 55 fire calls in the city 
were to the south side, and only three 
of them were structure.

A report is to be made at the next 
council meeting concerning firemen 
who would be available to answer 
calls when the city is cut in half by 
trains.

LARGEST TURNOUT of the three previous annual street 
dances sponsored by the Iowa Park Volunteer Fire 
Department was on hand Saturday night. Several hundred 
dancers and those who just enjoy watching others have a

good time were in the 100 block of West Cash until midnight. 
Revenue from the concession stands and donations will be 
used to purchase equipment for the department.

Auction Saturday bene fits children
Joe Parker, rancher and banker 

of Byers, is convinced that because 
people know what the Crippled 
Children's Livestock Auction is all 
about -that of people helping 
people-then donations will keep 
pouring in. Parker, general chairman 
of the auction, talked about the need 
for “more donors and more buyers" in 
this final week before the Saturday 
event.

He’s convinced, too, that despite

hard times in the cattle industry, 
ranchers and farmers will “weather" 
out the problems and make this 13th 
annual auction the biggest one ever.

Sale time is 10 a.m. Saturday at 
Wichita Livestock Auction, 2509 
Sheppard Access Road, Wichita Falls. 
Livestock and merchandise, such as 
paintings, bronzes from Shirley 
Wadzeck and Buck Brumley, area 
sculptors, handmade afghans, build­
ing supplies, livestock feed, western

gear and many other items to attempt 
buyers, will be auctioned off to 
benefit North Texas Rehabilitation 
Center in Wichita Falls.

“We’re really getting down to the 
end now,” Parker said at the recent 
luncheon for auction committee 
members.

Committee members met to turn in 
merchandise and donations from 
businessmen, citizens as well as 
ranchers and farmers and to complete

‘61 reunion 
date changed

Date for the 20th reunion of the 
Iowa Park High Class of ’61 has been 
changed to July 25, according to a 
letter mailed recently by Trish 
Heskett and Shirlene Berry.

The reunion, which was moved up a 
week, will be held at the Gateway Inn 
in Wichita Falls.

An informal get together will be 
held in the Chandelier Room from 
2-30 to 4:30 that afternoon, and 
dinner will be served at 7.

The meal and other expenses will 
cost $10 per person, according to the

,r those unable to attend, they 
isking classmates to write letters 
„g about themselves, their 
[lies and what they have done the 

20 years.

plans for the auction.
The cattle auction underwrites 

about half the budget for the rehab 
center, which is a facility to treat 
children and adults with physical 
handicaps, speech-language and 
hearing difficulties and language 
learning disabilities. Services are 
provided without regard for ability to 
pay.

Parker appealed to ranchers and 
farmers for livestock donations and 
said that committee members will see 
that livestock gets to the Saturday 
sale if donors do not have 
transportation. Any person wishing 
to donate may contact the county 
chairman or a committee member.

The MuleSkinners of Iowa Park 
will have barbecue sandwiches for

sale on auction day and cold drinks 
also will be available. Hollis Dickey of 
Ringling, Okla., will be auctioneer.

The auction serves a dual purpose, 
Parker said, in that it give ranchers 
and farmers a chance to greet old 
friends, visit and exchange news.

The 1981 Cattle Auction Poster 
Child is Christina Brown, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Brown of Wichita 
Falls. Christina has been coming to 
the rehab center since the age of two 
for speech, physical and occupational 
therapy for her handicap of cerebral 
palsy. She could not sit up or talk 
when she first came to the Center. 
Now, at 5 years, she is walking with 
the aid of short -leg braces, she talks 
plainly and even played T ball this 
summer.

FM 368 nears completion

PLAN AUCTION • Steve Brown, Em-1 Sargent, Stanley 
Williamson and Janies Easter, left to right, discuss the

Crippled Children’s Livestock Auction, 
chairman of WichiU County.

Williamson is

A road improvement project on FM 
368, .which was begun in January, will 
be completed within a week, 
according to a representative of the 
Texas Department of Highways and 
Transportation.

The project, which includes the 
widening of a bridge and reconstruc 
tion of approaches at Antelope Creek 
one mile south of the Wichita River 
and two miles north of FM 1206, was 
contracted by Timmins-Anderson of 
Wichita Falls.

According to the Highway 
Department representative, work on 
the project was delayed when other 
projects handled by Timmons-Ander-

son had exceeded the completion 
date, and the company sent all 
available equipment and labor to 
complete the work.

In the meantime, the section of FM 
368 under construction was left 
unattended for a period of several 
weeks, and the amount of travel over 
the unpaved section created large 
chuckholes and a possible hazardous 
situation.

According to workmen on the site, 
three inches of road surface will be 
graded to create a crown, then 
repaving will begin.
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York , B rock nuptial vows recited Saturday a fternoon
Following a wedding trip to 

Cloudcroft, New Mex., Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Wayne Brock, who were 
married Saturday afternoon at St. 
Paul's Catholic Church in Electra, will 
establish residence in Abilene.

Father David Johnson, pastor, and 
Rev. Bobby Gordon, a student at 
Southwestern Baptist Theological 
Seminary in Fort Worth, were the 
officiants for the impressive double- 
ring ceremony.

The bride is the former Miss Maria 
Catherine York, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Daniel J. York Sr. of Iowa Park 
and the groom is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. William R. Brock of Sweet­
water.

The bride was an exquisite picture 
in an original formal gown of white 
Chantilly lace worn over peau de soie. 
The pearl-sprinkled bodice was 
fashioned with a Queen Anne 
neckline edged in delicate Venise lace 
above a yoke of English net and a 
ruffle of pleated Chantilly lace. The 
long straight sleeves fit closely at the 
wrists with a wider band of Chantilly 
lace. Special skirt interest was 
created in a softly pleated panel in 
front with deep lace ruffles beginning 
at each side and cascading to a full 
cathedral length train.

The bride wore a white Southern 
Belle hat covered with matching 
Venise lace adorned with silk organza 
rosettes and seed pearls. White silk 
roses, stephanotis, gypsophila and 
green English ivy were chosen for the 
cascade bouquet which was a perfect 
complement to the bridal gown.

Adding a bit of special interest to 
her “something new" costume, she 
wore her mother’s baby ring on her 
little finger for “something old,” a 
friend’s garter provided “something 
borrowed and blue,” and she wore a 
good luck penny in her shoe.

The bride entered the church with 
her father who escorted her to the 
altar. On her way, she paused to pay 
tribute to her mother and to the 
groom’s mother presenting them with 
long stemmed red roses.

A decorative setting for the 
ceremony was built around an altar 
arrangement of white gladioli, pink 
carnations and baby's breath flanked 
by seven-branched candelabra hold­
ing burning white tapers. The 
solemnity of the setting was 
emphasized through the kneeling 
bench where the bride and groom 
knelt during the scripture reading, 
and the unity candelabrum. The silk

A

MRS. KENNETH WAYNE BROCK

bows which marked the pews 
featured the traditional bridal white.

Parents of the couple expressed 
their sanction of the union by lighting 
the outer candles in the candlestick 
and left them burning for the couple 
to use later to light the center candle 
to symbolize their union.

The wedding music was provided 
by Denny Anderson, pianist, and 
Wendell Burnam, vocalist. For 
prelude selections, the pianist played 
“Fantasie,” “Fur Elise,” and “Clair de 
Lune.” He accompanied the vocalist 
for his vocal offerings, “Always and 
Forever," “The Wedding Song” 
during the time the bride and groom 
were lighting the unity candle, “The 
Lord’s Prayer” at the close of the 
ceremony, and “Follow Me” for the 
recessional. The pianist played 
“Trumpet Voluntary” for the 
processional.

The bride was attended by her 
sister, Mrs. Elton Wolter of Houston 
as matron of honor, and Mrs. Keith 
Brock of Sweetwater, sister-in-law of 
the groom, as bridesmaid. They wore 
identical gowns of pink eyelet 
fashioned with sytlish attached capes 
that covered their shoulders and full 
gathered skirts. Clasping the dresses 
at the waistlines were wide sashes 
that criss-crossed in front and 
terminated in long streamers in the 
back. Pink rosebuds and baby’s 
breath were featured in their nose* 
gays, and in their hair, they wore 
combs covered with pink silk
blosaoms.

The groom wore a silver Ashley 
tuxedo with white shirt, ascot tie, and

a white rose and baby's breath 
boutonniere. Masculine participants 
and fathers of the couple wore 
tuxedos to match the groom's.

Keith Brock of Sweetwater, twin 
brother of the groom, served as best 
man and Bob Carlton of Abilene was 
groomsman. Mike McElroy and Billy 
Shelton, both of Abilene, ushered and 
seated guests.

The bride was graduated from 
Iowa Park High School and received a 
B.S. degree from Texas Tech Univ. in 
home economics. The groom was 
graduated from Sweetwater High 
School and from Hardin Simmons 
Univ. at Abilene with a B.B.A. degree 
in accounting. He is employed as an 
auditor for the Department of Human 
Resources in Abilene and she is 
employed as a day care licensing 
representative for the same firm.

When guests arrived at the church 
for the wedding, they registered 
under the direction of Miss Marianne 
York, sister of the bride, at a table in 
the foyer covered with white lace 
over pink satin. The appointments 
were a crystal vase filled with pink 
silk rosebuds and baby's breath, a 
natural wicker basket decked with 
pink silk bows holding the white net 
birdseed bags tied with pink ribbons, 
the book and pink plume pen.

A reception honoring the couple 
was held immediately following the 
wedding in the Fellowship Hall and 
hosted by the bride’s parents. The 
bride headed the receiving line and 
introduced her new husband to her 
friends. Parents of the couple stood in 
the line with them. Mrs. York wore a 
street length mauve Qiana dress 
accented with sheer sleeves and a 
sheer bow tie at the neckline that 
extended in streamers to the 
waistline. Mrs. Brock was attired in a 
light blue street length Qiana dress 
trimmed with white embroidered lace 
and long sleeves. Both wore white 
camellia corsages.

The refreshment table was draped 
to the floor with white lace over white 
crepe. The floral centerpiece 
consisting of an arrangement of pink 
and white carnations, cushion poms 
and gypsophila arranged in a crystal 
and silver epergne stood out 
beautifully in the decor. Comple 
mental appointments were the 
crystal punch service, cake and pink 
napkins accented with silver 
Christograms, symbolizing marriage 
in Christ, above “Kenneth-Cathy. 
July 11, 1981.”

Walls9 Cooke wedding rites recited
Miss Diane Renee Walls and 

Patrick Alan Cooke were married 
Saturday evening at the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W.H. Clayton, 
in a ceremony officiated by Rev. Ed 
Lane, pastor of the Lakeside Baptist 
Church in Wichita Falls. The groom is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Douglas 
Cooke.

The couple recited their vows 
before the fireplace in the den. The 
mantel was centered with a bouquet 
of blue roses and white carnations 
flanked by brass holders topped with 
white candles in hurricane globes. At 
one side of the hearth stood a column 
of potted greenery.

The bride was given in marriage by 
her father. She wore a white lace 
gown over white Qiana designed with 
a natural waist bodice, high collar and 
long sleeves. She wore a waltz length 
illusion mantilla-style headpiece and 
carried a bouquet of white roses and 
baby's breath.

Miss Malinda Reaves, the bride’s 
attendant, was attired in a light blue 
Qiana gown complemented with a 
matching sheer jacket and wore a 
wrist corsage of blue carnations.

MRS. PATRICK COOKE

Kevin Merkel was the groom’s 
attendant.

A reception was held at the bride’s 
home following the wedding. The 
refreshment table was covered with 
white lace over blue knit and 
appointed with the cake, crystal

Special beauty-, in the table was 
stressed in the four-tiered cake 
characterized by a florid style of 
ornamentation, drop garlands, shell 
borders and one set of sugar pillars. 
The tiers were abloom with pink and 
white cascading flowers featuring 
bridal trumpets, agapanthus. roses, 
stephanotis, petunias, gently con­
trasted with burgundy forget-me- 
nots, and the same blossoms were 
used in a cluster for the top garniture.

During the reception, refreshments 
were served by Miss Elaine Morrison 
of Beaumont, Miss Susanne Morgan 
of San Angelo, and Miss Kyleen 
Peloquen of Abilene.

Tables where guests were seated 
for refreshments were covered with 
white cloths and held white candles 
afloat in pink water.

Houseparty members were Mmes. 
Gordon Griffith, Ray Sharpe, Daniel 
York Jr. and Anthony York.

The groom’s parents were hosts for 
a catered rehearsal dinner Friday at 
the Chamber of Commerce in Electra.

Other out-of-town wedding guests 
were Mrs. Edith Brock of Clyde, 
grandmother of the groom, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gerald Ramsey of Lewiston, 
Idaho and Elton Wolter of Houston.

CARD OF THANKS
To our friends and neighbors 

who gave so much of themselves in 
meeting our needs through comfort­
ing and encouraging words and acts 
of kindness during the illness and 
death of our beloved husband, 
brother and uncle, we express our 
deepest gratitude. Special thanks to 
the Iowa Park Volunteer Fire 
Department for the assistance given 
before his passing and to the Rev. Hal 
Farnsworth for his spiritual ministry. 
God’s blessing upon each of you.

Jack Denny and 
Family of L.C. “Kelly” Denny

Catlins to observe  
50th  anniversary

Friends of Mr. and Mrs. Cecil 
Catlin are invited to attend a 
reception that will be held for them 
from 2 to 4 p.m. Sunday in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Garland R. Rusk to 
commemorate their 50th wedding 
anniversary.

The reception will be hosted by the 
couple's children, Mr. and Mrs. Rusk, 
Mr. and Mrs. James Ridlehuber, Mr. 
and Mrs. Delbert Catlin and Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Catlin, and they will be 
assisted by the honored couple’s 
grandchildren.

The former Vida Robinson and 
Cecil Catlin were married July 17, 
1931, in Grandfield, Okla. He is an 
independent oil operator and they 
have lived in the Iowa Park 
community most of their lives.

B r ii 
Regis

MR. and MRS. CECIL CATLIN

They have 13 grandchildren and 11 
great grandchildren.

ESA district council
The first quarterly meeting of 

District VI Council of E.S.A. was held 
Sunday at the Community Center in 
Burkbumett with Theta Epsilon 
chapter as hostess. Fifty-three 
members represented 10 of the 11 
chapters of the district and three 
guests were present.

Lois Riddle of Arlington, president, 
conducted the business session. Mrs. 
Bill Hmcirik of Epsilon Eta chapter in 
Iowa Park, district vice-president,

presented awards for yearbooks, 
rushing, histories and scrapbooks for 
previous years.

Special recognition was given to 
Patricia Posvic, four years-old, for 
her participation in the Skate-A-Thon 
sponsored by Theta Epsilon. She 
skated nine hours and collected 
$166.75 for St. Jude Children’s 
Hospital, which is a project of the 
chapters of District VI.

Friendship class 
makes donations -
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punch service and blue tapers 
burning in single crystal holders. The 
cake of three tiers and one set of 
Grecian pillars was decorated with 
refreshing blue roses, shellwork and 
drapes in frosting designs. The top 
tier held a blown glass ornament 
accented with love birds and wedding 
bells.

Mrs. Edward Ewing, sister of the 
bride, and Mrs. Tom Gruber, her 
cousin, served at the refreshment 
table during the reception.

The bride and groom were both 
graduated from Iowa Park High 
School and are presently employed at 
Cryovac. After a short wedding trip 
to Dallas, they are at home in Wichita 
Falls.

Eighteen members of the 
Friendship class of First Baptist 
Church were in attendance at the 
regular monthly meeting held 
Monday evening in the Fellowship 
Hall of the church. Mrs. Ruth Hill and 
Mrs. Homer Blalock were hostesses.

Mrs. D.H. Ford, president, directed 
the business meeting. Mrs. Elmer 
Singleton, community missions chair­
man. reported that approximately 
$250 worth of clothing and food had 
been taken to Faith City Mission 
during June. It was voted to take food 
articles to the mission for the July 
project. It was also voted to make a 
monthly contribution to the Carillon 
Bell fund of the church.

Mrs. E.T. Patterson was in charge 
of the devotional period, using “Love, 
Trust, Peace” as the basis for her 
thoughts. She closed by reading a 
patriotic article, “Truth Eternal.”

Fri., July 17 - Polish sausage, red 
beans, green salad, cornbread, fruit 
cocktail.
Mon., July 20 • Italian steak, 
spaghetti, squash, salad, peaches. 
Tues., July 21 - Meat loaf, sliced 
potatoes, English peas, cole slaw, 
cantaloupe.
Wed., July 22 - Liver, rice, carrots, 
tomatoes, applesauce.
Thurs., July 23 - Goulash, okra, pear 
& cottage cheese, cornbread, oatmeal 
cake.

LISA McBAY 
and

JERRY McGEE

BEA WHITTON 
and

STEVE SPRUIELL

LISA LANE 
and

RAYMOND SMITH

DONICE KIDWELL 
and

JEFF SPRUIELL

JAN TENNANT
amd

BENNIE HORTON

RENEE WILLIAMS 
and

JEFF HENSLEY

JL'DY IFULFER1 
and

JOEL LOVELADY

CATHERINE [YORK! 
and

KENNETH BROCK

MICHELLE [HILLARD] 
and

DAVID KERR 
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Together we can make it happen!

Call Sue M artin 766*4131
Professional Bldg. Wichita Falls
1901 10th St. at Denver Hours: 8 a.m. to 5 p.m.
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R obertson , Patterson vows exchanged here Saturday evening

,igives a man a good fooling,

Chicken Fry

WilsonChuck ShurfineBologna
To Know He's Dealing ’V  
With Folks Who Care

customers are our friends and neighbors as well

2 Liter
Plastic Bottle

Shurfine evaporated 
M ilk 13 oz. Can
Shurfine Macaroni & Cheese

Dinners
Show Boat

Shurfine

Catsup

DIRECTORS 
Fred Dwyer 
O.N. Newman 
Fred Parkey 
W .R. Steger 
Stanley Williamson 
Joe Williamson 
Bert Williamson

Delsey Bathroom ur r ivcjuu
Stanley Williamson, Chairman of the Board A President
H.M. Nipper, Senior Executive Vke President
David Parkey, Senior Executive Vice President
Bert Williamson, Vice President
Roberta Hill, Vice President and Cashier
Jean Hopkins, Vice President
Janis Latimer, Vice President and Asst. Cashier
Ruby Strickland, Asst. Vice President

Shurfine Tissue
Double Luck

Discount Foods Member F.D.I.C.
107 West Park

The candlelight nuptial setting at 
the altar of First Baptist Church 
Saturday evening for the wedding of 
Miss Tammie Jean Rohertaon and
Mark Alton Patterson was rharar
terized by a beauty that could not be 
described in words.

An abundance of votive candles 
twinkled in white wrought iron 
arched, seven branched and spiral 
candelabra traced with boxwood 
studded with pink roses the length of 
the rostrum on either side of a center 
archway trimmed with the same 
greenery and roses and background­
ed by tree candelabra.

The picture was completed with 
the addition of two bouquets of pink 
carnations and leather leaf raised by 
tall white Grecian columns, and palm 
fronds in the lower altar as a 
contrasting accent. Church pews 
were decorated with white tapers 
burning in hurricane globes atop tall 
white standards trimmed with 
sprengeri fern and pink silk bows 
with trailing ribbons.

The double ring ceremony was 
officiated by Rev. Howell Farnsworth 
to unite the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Robertson and the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. James “Bud" Patterson.

The foyer of the church where 
guests signed the wedding book upon 
arriving for the ceremony was 
decorated to create a summertime 
look. Doormen who directed guests to 
enter through the center door were 
Monty Todd and Wesly Todd, cousins 
of the bride. The doors on either side 
were centered with large pink satin 
bows.

The white wrought-iron garden 
furniture in the entry featured a 
round glass top table and two chairs 
with tall backs where Mrs. Russell 
Yarbrough and Mrs. Stan Clines, 
cousins of the bride, assisted guests 
with registering. The table was 
centered with a white bird cage 
entwined with silk ivy and pink apple 
blossoms sheltering two white 
feathered doves nesting in poufs of 
white net.

Arnold Joe Robertson II and 
Leanne Lowrance, cousins of the 
bride, handed out the couple's 
wedding scrolls from white wicker 
baskets.

The musical setting was provided 
by Miss Lynette Flick, pianist, Miss 
Jane Dickey and Miss Michelle 
Mueller, vocalists. Miss Flick’s 
prelude offerings included “Theme

MRS. MARK ALTON PATTERSON

from Ice Castles,” “ Hawaiian 
Wedding Song," and “What A 
Difference You've Made in My Life." 
She played accompaniment for Miss 
Dickey's solo number, “You Decor 
ated My Life” after mothers of the 
couple were seated, and for Miss 
Mueller’s presentation of “Welcome 
to My World." The pianist included 
the traditional processional by 
Wagner and the recessional by 
Mendelssohn in her offerings.

The bride was escorted to the altar 
by her father who presented her in 
marriage for her parents.

The soft glow of white chiffon with 
luxurious Venise lace artfully applied 
created the mood for the bridal gown. 
The scoop neckline, raised bodice and 
sheer sleeves were elaborately 
trimmed with lace appliques and 
pearls to complement the full skirt 
that flowed into a graceful chapel 
length train.

Her fingertip veil of illusion gently 
bordered with lace drifted from a 
Juliet cap of lace. To complete the 
picture, the bride carried a white 
Bible topped with a cascade bouquet 
fashioned of pink roses, gypsophila 
and streamers.

She kept bridal traditions by 
attaching to a ribbon in her Bible a 
ring that belonged to her paternal 
grandmother. Mrs. Clyde Robertson, 
and a pearl stich pin of Mrs. Fred 
Toler, her maternal grandmother, for 
“something old". She wore her 
mother’s diamond earrings for 
“something borrowed"; chose her 
gown for the memorable day in her 
life for "something new” , and wore 
the garter for the "something blue" 
accessory.

The bride was preceded to the altar 
by a maid of honor, three bridesmaids 
and a flower girl. Miss Mickie Gregg 
took part in the wedding as maid of 
honor. Miss Dana Hicks, Miss Wendy 
Hicks and Miss Laura Dowell were 
bridesmaids. The maid of honor 
carried a nosegay of pink sweetheart 
roses, baby's breath with matching 
streamers on a white Bible, and the 
bridesmaids carried nosegays of pink 
carnations and baby's breath on their 
Bibles which emphasized the beauty 
of their gowns. Styled identically, the 
pink Qiana dresses were made with 
the popular natural waist bodices 
covered with lace, spaghetti straps 
and A line skirts. To complete their 
costumes, they added lace jackets.

Miss Amanda Patterson, niece of 
the groom, the flower girl, wore a 
long pink sheer frock styled with 
ruffles that formed the sleeves and 
tiers of the long skirt. She carried a 
smaller version of the attendant's 
nosegays on a white Bible.

Cody Ix>w ranee of Chico, cousin of 
the bride, was ring bearer.

The groom wore a formal slate gray 
tuxedo with tails, white shirt, and a 
boutonniere formed of pink rosebuds, 
leather leaf. All masculine partici­
pants wore slate gray tuxedos. 
Fathers of the couple wore white 
shirts and the other wore pink shirts.

Ran Yarbrough, the bride's cousin, 
served as best man. Three brothers of 
the groom, Micky Patterson of 
Anson, Ricky Patterson and Roger 
Patterson, both of Wichita Falls, 
were groomsmen. Duties of ushering 
guests to their seats were assumed 
by Rowdy Robertson, brother of the 
bride. Greg Patterson, brother of the

COUNTER TOPPING
FORMICA WILSON-ART MICARTA 

“BUY FROM THE OLD PRO"
T.S. THOMAS, CABINE1M AKER 

1516 Beverlv Wichita Falls Ph. 723-6623

groom. Royce Atrhley and Russell 
Yarbrough, the bride's cousin.

The mother of the bride wore a 
formal georgette gown of mauve pink 
defined with a natural waist bodice, 
Victorian style neckline bordered 
with a self pleated ruffle, long sheer 
sleeves and A line skirt. The mother 
of the groom wore a long pink double 
knit dress with long sleeves, a pink 
lace stand up collar and a full length 
jacket. Their corsages consisted of 
white carnations, pink roses mixed 
with baby's breath.

The postnuptial reception was 
given by the bride's parents in the 
Fellowship Hall of the church which 
was decorated in extremely good 
taste.

The bride's table, draped to the 
floor with white lace, stood out in the 
setting with striking beauty and 
charm. The centerpiece was a 
splashing pink water fountain 
surrounded by eight tall white cherub 
columns and topped with an 
arrangement of pink carnations and 
sprengeri fern with the greenery 
extending around the columns.

The five tiered bride's cake with 
three sets of Grecian pillars was a 
queenly confection garnished with 
dramatic patterns of icing and 
cascades of pink frosting roses. The 
roses were used in a cluster on the 
top tier where a miniature bride and 
groom stood before a heart of pearls 
lightly touched with pink and white 
accents.

Punch was served with an antique 
silver ladle from the crystal bowl. The 
bridal napkins bearing the names of 
the bride and groom and their 
wedding date and pink bell shaped 
mints added interest to the table 

' decor.
Presiding at the bride's table were 

Mmes. Bruce Lowrance, Johnny 
Ijowrance. Eddie Richardson and

Dorene Huff, cousins of the bride.
Mrs. Ricky Patterson and Mrs 

Mtckv Patterson, sisters in law of the 
groom, served at his table laid with 
light gray silk over charcoal gray 
crepe. The appointment with the 
greatest eye appeal was a cowboy 
boot filled with bearded wheat in the 
center, flanked by the chocolate cake 
set off with horseshoe frosting 
designs, and the silver coffee service.

A white metal three tiered cart 
held the white lace rice bags tied with 
pink ribbons which were distributed 
by Wendy and Courtney Patterson, 
nieces of the groom. Elsewhere in the 
room, a white draped table held a 
five branched silver candelabrum 
filled with tall pink tapers and 
nosegays of the bridal attendants to 
add extra beauty to the setting.

Houseparty members were Mmes,' 
Doyle Parks, l^arry latimer. Jimmy 
Banks. Gene Iterance and James 
Yarbrough.

The rehearsal dinner was given by 
the groom's parents Friday evening 
at the First United Pentecostal 
Church.

The bride and groom left the 
reception in their wedding clothes 
and went to the home of her parents 
to change into their traveling clothes 
as they departed for Kuidoso, N.M 
They will live in Iowa Park. Both 
were graduated from Iowa Park High 
School and he is a self employed 
contract welder

Grandparents of the couple. Mr. 
and Mrs. Floyd Boyd. Mr. and Mrs 
Fred Toler and Mr and Mrs. Clyde
Robertson were special guests.

Thursday - Friday - Saturday

SPRINGS
SUMMER Sale
20% to 50%

OFF REGULAR PRICES
Petites, Jrs., MisSy 

and Half Sizes
Dresses - Pants - Blouses - Shorts * 

Bathing Suits - Pant Suits - Skirts - Shoes

Verna's Apparel
113 W. Park 5V2-49II
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AsISeelt By BOB HAMILTON

SUPER POWERFUL tractors and trucks will be 
demonstrated tomorrow and Saturday night in the annual 
Wichita County Young Farmers’ tractor pull. To be held in

the Red River Rodeo Arena, on FM 369 between the old 
Wichita Falls Highway and Seymour Road, competition will
begin at 7:30 p.m.

0000000000000000000000000000000000000000005000000000000000000000000000000000000

Cook o f  the Week

Who were those people and 
nations who jumped on the 
bandwagon in blaming the wrongs of 
the Shah of Iran for lulling all those 
people, and are they saying the same 
things about the present government 
and the hundreds who have been 
executed?

And speaking about who said what. 
. . . .  who was it who complained about 
the coolness and wetness of June?

Newspaper publishers keep a 
mental list of businesses and 
individuals we call “dead beats.” They 
are the ones who want free publicity 
and never want to pay for 
advertising.

You wouldn’t believe the offers we 
have for stories about products and

Planning family meals has 
always been, and always will be. a 
very special job for the homemaker. 
It requires a lot of thought to serve 
meals each day that have a healthful 
balance of the "Big Four” food 
groups.

A very personal responsibility lies 
in the hands of young mothers 
because they are educating their 
children to eat for a long, healthful 
lifetime; and early food habits begin 
at their own tables every mealtime.

In this time of tight economy, many 
homemakers are finding it hard at 
times to plan, prepare and serve a 
variety of nutritious meals without 
“leaving them limp and the kitchen in 
wild disorder.” They are looking for 
food bargains on the shelves in the 
grocery stores and scanning daily 
leftovers with an eye to the food 
budget.

Wise mothers consider the family's 
food tastes and do not force certain 
foods on them. They have learned 
that appetites lag occasionally and 
that family members tire of eating 
inside all the time, so they plan an 
outdoor meal or encourage Dad and 
the children to fix a meal occasionally. 
The last idea is sure to cause the 
family’s appreciation of the regular 
cook’s efforts to grow with each of 
their own cooking adventures.

Evelyn (Mrs. Robert! Kinnett's 
recipes for the w eek suggest that she 
plans menus with an artist’s eye by 
varying the color and texture of food 
combinations. She has a fondness for 
German foods and shares two of her 
favorite recipes this week.

A native of Wichita Falls, Mrs. 
Kinnett was graduated from Hirschi 
High School. She is continuing her 
education at Midwestern State Univ. 
where she is working toward a 
bachelor of science degree. She is also 
working as a technician at North 
Texas Dialysis Center. She is very 
interested in P-TA work and politics. 
She enjoys cooking, sewing and 
ceramics.

Mr. and Mrs. Kinnett are members 
of Faith Baptist Church. He works for 
Falls City Casing Pullers. They have 
two sons, Lonnie, a high school 
freshman, and Brian, a first grader.

RAGOUT ALA BERGHOFF
*A cup butter
3 V* lbs. boneless round steak, cut into 
thin strips
1 cup chopped onions 
1V* cups chopped green peppers
1 lb. mushrooms, sliced 
V* cup flour
2 cups beef broth 
1 t salt
1 t Worcestershire sauce 
Few drops Tabasco sauce 
1 cup dry white wine

Melt V* butter in large fry pan. 
Brown meat over medium high heat. 
Remove from fry pan.

Mrs. Robert Kinnett

onionIn remaining butter, saute 
for 2 minutes. Add green pepper and 
mushrooms; cook an additional 3 
minutes. Melt 'A cup butter, add 
flour; slowly add broth, cook until 
thickened. Stir in wine and 
seasonings. Add meat and mush­
rooms. Cover and simmer 45 minutes 
or 1 hour. Serve with buttered 
n o o d le s  o r  dumplings. Serves 8.

jkt, i ,,v» *v- v*,
R E D  C A B B A G E  S A L A D  

5 slices bacon
1 t sugar
2 T vinegar
‘A cup red or white wine 
V* head red cabbage, shredded 
2 T vegetable oil 
V* t salt 
V« t pepper 
1 t caraway seeds 

Fry bacon in medium size fry pan 
until crisp. Remove and drain. Add 
sugar, vinegar and wine to bacon fat; 
stir and cook until sugar is dissolved. 
Pour this hot mixture over the 
cabbage. Toss with vegetable oil, salt, 
pepper, caraway seeds. Sprinkle with 
crumbled bacon over mixture.

SPINACH DIP
1 jar baby food spinach, strained 
1 pt. mayonnaise 
*A cup parsley flakes 
‘A cup onion flakes 

Season with salt and lemon juice to 
taste. Mix together and refrigerate at 
least 8 hours before serving. Can be 
used with chips or vegetables.

PEACH PRALINES 
1 can peach halves 
V* cup shredded coconut 
*A cup brown sugar 
Vs cup orange juice 
8 large marshmallows or 2 cups 
miniature marshmallows 

Drain peach halves and place them 
outside up in greased baking dish.

Sprinkle with coconut. Combine 
brown sugar and orange juice and 
pour over peaches. Place a 
marshmallow in center of each. Bake 
in 350 degree oven for 15 minutes.

TUNA BAKE
Vj cup chopped green pepper 
3 T chopped onion 
3 T fat 
1 t salt 
6 T flour
1-10 Vs or 11 oz. can chicken with rice 
soup
17s cups milk 
1 can tuna 
1 T lemon juice

Cook peppers and onion in hot fat, 
add salt and flour, then add soup and 
milk. Cook until sauce is thick. Add 
tuna and lemon juice. Put mixture in 
greased pan and put biscuits on top. 
Bake 30 minutes at 425 degrees.

TUNA BURGERS
1 can tuna
1 cup chopped celery 
Vs cup diced American cheese 
Vs cup chopped olives 
'A cup mayonnaise 
1 onion, chopped

M ix ab ove  ingredients and make 
into patties. B a k e  1 5  to  20 m inutes at
350 degrees. Place on 6 hamburger
buns.

services we receive through the mail. 
A newspaper could easily publish 20 
to 30 pages each week, completely 
filled with dead beat material.

Monday’s mail, for instance, 
included a news release, complete 
with photograph, pamphlet and 
personal letter to the editor, about a 
self protection aerosol that is better 
than a gun in case of a riot. The 
president of the company even 
offered a free sample, and then, as an 
enticement to get me to run the 
article, asked for my rate card.

The Imperial Sugar company has 
hired the services of a "public 
relations and advertising” firm to 
send out news stories all the time. 
This week’s release was about 
making sun tea. Why would Imperial 
be interested in that? Simple, unlike 
some instant tea, if you like your tea 
sweetened, you have to add sugar.

The state comptroller Bob Bullock 
is one of the leading dead beats. He 
uses state funds to send out "news 
releases” regularly, and many of

them take political issue with some 
other politician’s ideas about 
legislation.

Some of Bullock’s products are real 
beauts, such as one that came this 
week. With full color pictures on 
almost every page, the pamphlet 
which must have cost thousands of 
dollars to produce tells us “Why 
Texas Is Growing.” Now, that’s a 
dandy for a bookkeeper to put out for 
the public.

Bullock even hired his own 
personal public information man who 
believes his boss’ name should appear 
within the first four words of any 
story coming out of the office.

One of my favorite dead beats is 
the professional organizations, like 
medical, legal, accounting and 
veterinary groups. They’ve got so 
many ethics that it’s against their 
good name to buy or pay for an 
advertisement, but each, except for 
the legal, has a contest each year to 
give a plaque to the reporter writing 
the best story about their profession.

GLENN TODD was presented the 
rank of Eagle Scout Sunday evening 
at First United Methodist Church by 
Ron Barnes. A sophomore at Iowa

I U * W .  h e  iaa I S  y e a r s  o l d  a n d  t i l e
son of Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Todd. He 
has been in Scouting since 1977.
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T E X A S  P R E SS
A s e o c i  A T  1 a  N  (

C o a ls  o u r m ost abunclar it f u e l . . .

le d  go a h e a d
a n d use it

Vuhffino «>/ bvreaucrutk. rcguLituim restrict <mr us, o c il,« . time u tu n its use needs to tv eticnurugei
We Americans have 

always been forward-looking people. 
We’ve always kept our eyes —  and 
our options— open .

An energy option we need 
to exercise is the use of coal to gener­
ate electricity. It makes sense: O w l is 
our most abundant fuel with known 
reserves that will last more than 100 
years at present rates o f  consumption, 
its cost is rising slower than that ot 
other fuels; and using it helps reduce 
our petroleum imports.

The largest obstacle to 
our continued development of this 
necessary resource is over-:ealous

government regulation. Us imposing 
unnecessary measures this unrealistic 
ow-regulation slows our progress, 
increases rhe cost of \our electricity, 
and does little or nothing to protect 
the environment. For example

• Present standards tor coal plants 
require mote stringent emission 
limits on a plant using low-sulfur 
coal than a plant using high-sulfur 
coal, which, in effect, provides 
an incentive to use "dirtier" soul 
and penalizes plants that use low 
sulfur or "cleaner" coal

• Regulatory documentation tor a 
permit to mint- coal in Texas m

1^75 consisted o f a single report 
about one-half inch thick. 
Obtaining permits tor the same 
area in N80 required volumes 
of reports.

NXe have the technology 
j'jday to use coal cleanly and safely.
It n plentiful and relatively inexpen- 
'i\ e. it its use is not over-regulated. 
And we need the energy now.

_,lexas Electric Service
Company

W N HOUSE. Manager. Phone 59? 4M9

l
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Y O U R  IN D E P E N D E N T  F O O D  STORE
" W E  C A N  SELL FO R  LESS" This Week'j

300 West Bank

Fresh Frosted  
Chopped

Beef Steak
S Lb.
Box * 6 *
This Ad Good Thru Sunday 

July 18th

Fresh Frosted

Fryer
Breast

5 Lb. Box

* 5 9 9

Silver Spur Sliced

Slab Bacon Lb. $109

Super Jack

Ground
Chuck

$ 1 5 8
Lb. i We Reserve The Right To limit Quantities

Rodeo Meat

’jj01- *119
P k g .  I

Rodeo Bologna
Family Pak

Cubed Steak u. ‘ 2 w

Hot Dogs 11“  9 8 *
$  1 8 8Hillshire Farm Smoked Sausage Lb. I  

Family Pak

Round Steak l $ | 6 8

AROUND!

H eavy Beef

T-Bone
Steak

$ 0 9 6
Lb. Mm

Limit 1
U.S. No. 1 Russet

Potatoes S i * ' *1
Red DeliciousGeorgia Yellow

Peaches Onions Apples
1 2 5  c t .

4 * 1 i o / * i

Shurfine

Flour

Rainbow Processed

Dill Pickles ’5T
Green Giant Nibblers

9 9 * Cob Com  6 Ear. 99^

Grand Opening In Electro, Texas
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LOUIS SEFCIK By Bob Hamilton

Wheel chair 
no handicap 
to jewler’s happiness

An old description of a man who 
was a poor worker was “He sits on
the job."

Well, Louis Sefcik sits on the job. 
In fact, he sits while feeding his 
livestock, while fishing and all the 
rest of the time. But he has to sit. 
He’s paralyzed from the waist down, 
and he’s no poor worker.

Louis, who owns and operates 
Louis’ Jewelry, is like most all those 
who are handicapped: he’s an
inspiration to those of us who 
supposedly have no handicaps. His 
friendliness, his outlook on life, his 
willingness to help, his taking part in 
community affairs, cannot be 
overlooked.

But there's one thing he scorns: 
sympathy. As far as he is concerned, 
he isn’t handicapped. It just takes him 
a little longer to get around than
most.

During an interview, he asked this 
writer if he knew the definition of 
handicap. And with a gleam in his 
eye, he referred to a dictionary which 
stated, in effect, it was an equalizer. 
He was referring to the term used in

“There are not many 
people Vd trade places
with.'

sports, like horse racing or golfing, 
where the leader is burdened to allow 
the others an equal chance to win.

“There’s not many people I’d trade 
places with,” he stated very frankly. 
"I don't like it (being restricted to a 
wheel chair) at all, but I’ve learned to 
put up with it.”

Born early in 1934 on a farm 
northeast of Harrold, he led a normal 
life of a Texas farm boy. He went 
through all the grades in school at 
Harrold, played six-man football, 
basketball and ran track, and was in 
Vocational Agriculture.

And he graduated with his class, 
but there was a question for a while is 
he would be present for the 
ceremonies.

In October of his senior year, 1951, 
he had played a football game on a 
Thursday night, and left the next 
morning for Dallas to attend the state 
fair. The Vo-Ag group returned home 
Saturday, and he recalls he was hot 
and not feeling well. The condition 
remained through Sunday.

Monday, still feeling badly, he went 
to see a doctor. The diagnosis was 
that he was still feeling the effects of 
a bad bruise on a hip from Thursday’s 
football game.

But Tuesday morning, he knew 
something was definitely wrong. One 
of his legs wouldn’t respond when he 
tried to get out of bed. Straight to the 
doctor he was taken, and this time the 
diagnosis was corrected. Polio.

He had been able to walk into the 
doctor’s office, by keeping his knee 
stiff. But when the doctor determined 
the problem, he was taken directly to 
Wichita General Hospital by 
ambulance. There, he was given a 
spinal tap and told to lie still. “The 
next morning I woke up about as I am 
now,” he said, looking down at his 
lifeless legs.

Eventhough there were a number 
of polio victims in the hospital, the 
facility was ill equipped to give 
therapy at that time. Only one woman 
was working in the department, 
trying to work with all the patients.

Louis remembers making a strong 
friendship with the late Donald Cope 
of Iowa Park, who occupied the 
room next to his.

He remained in the Wichita Falls 
facility until mid December, when he 
was transferred to the rehabilitation 
center at Gonzales. While taking 
therapy there, he continued his 
education. “ I only needed three 
credits to graduate, and when I got 
back to Harrold in April, I was ahead 
of the rest of my class in math. And 
they told me I could graduate if I 
passed the tests in English and 
history,” he recalled.

He was walking on crutches across 
the stage when he received his 
diploma in May, graduating second in

“/ don ’f like it at all, 
butVve learned to live 
with it.”

his class. "The one who graduated 
first in the class was a girl who sat 
right in front of me,” he quipped, 
implying he looked over her shoulder 
from time to time.

The next fall, he entered a 
watchmaking course which was 
offered at Midwestern University. 
After two semesters, the course was 
closed at the Wichita Falls school, and 
he transferred to Kilgore Junior 
College.

Asked how a big-fingered farm boy 
happened to choose a field working 
w ith  sm all w o r k in g s  o f  w a tch e s , h e
said his aptitude test indicated 
mechanics.

“I think he (the counselor) told me

“Iget along with kids better than anything...

mechanical was number one, and
m o u n t a i n  c l i m b i n g  n u m b e r  t.WO.** h e
laughed.

In 1953 Louis went to work for Bill 
Holder, the jeweler at Archer City. 
Things were going well for the young 
man on crutches, until yet another 
tragedy struck.

“About a year after I went to work 
for Bill, I got sick. Tests and x-rays 
showed I had TB (tuberculosis). 
There were some complications and a 
delay of about two weeks. Then one 
day a nurse came into the room and 
told me to roll over on my back,” he 
recalled.

When he attempted to roll over, 
the muscles in his stomach somehow 
tore. Surgery was required. And the 
main cure for TB was rest, so he 
spent the next two years in bed.

It apparently was the lack of 
activity during those two years which 
caused Louis to completely lose what 
leg muscles he had remaining from 
his bout with polio. Leg braces and 
crutches could no longer support him, 
and he has been restricted to the 
wheel chair since 1955.

With the aid of a brace he wears 
around his waist, which he must 
return to Gonzales annually for a new 
one to be built, he opened his own 
store in 1956 in the building east of 
the present Discount Food Store. His 
former employer, Holder, helped him 
by stocking the store. He repaid his 
benefactor as he sold the merchan­
dise. He remained in that location 
until moving to his present location in 
Park West Shopping Center 11 years 
later.

It was also in 1967 that he married 
his wife, Betty, who brought with her 
a ready-made family of three 
children: Audrey, Lydia and George 
Bushfield. Having a family was also 
good therapy for Louis. “ I get along 
with kids better than anything. If I 
could get along with adults like I do 
kids, everything would be easier,” he 
said.

He had seen a friend’s car equipped 
for complete hand driving, and soon 
had one equipped for himself. He was 
confident of his ability to drive the 
automobile, but the problem was 
convincing his parents. Like all 
parents, his wanted to protect him 
from harm until they were convinced 
the car was safe to operate.

He's had two accidents driving his 
specially-equipped cars, and neither 
was avoidable or his fault. The first 
wreck, he was stopped at a stop sign, 
and the second, the other driver 
failed to stop at a marked intersection 
and hit him broadside.

He likes to tell the story of a 
discussion between Sam Fairchild, 
the body shop owner, and an

insurance adjuster, after Louis’
w n n d  accident.

The adjuster was playing it close 
and not offering to have some work 
done when Sam told him “Fella, the 
driver of this car hasn’t taken a step 
since the wreck.” He laughs and said 
the adjuster told Sam to fix whatever 
he felt was necessary.

The Sefciks lived on Vogel until 
1968, when they moved to their home 
in the country. They lived near his 
father, who was ill, and Louis could 
help look after him and the livestock. 
“ I still like going out and checking the 
livestock,” he said.

Just as soon as I had enough 
money, I bought me an old wooden 
boat,” he said, concerning his love of 
fishing. He justified the purchase: 
"It’s easier to travel in a boat on the 
water than on an old rocky bank, by 
far.

Louis loves to fish, and does just 
about every chance he can get. It is 
not only his one apparent vice, but 
also serves as a form of continuing 
therapy.

If he hasn't the opportunity to go 
with someone to a lake, he often 
wheels himself to a stock tank near 
his home.

Being relegated to a wheel chair 
presents some problems to Louis, but 
few of them are major. Stairs are his 
nemesis.

He gets in and out of his automobile 
as easily as he does his bed. . . by 
himself. Few projects around the

home or shop are major obstacles. 
But he recalls once dropping his 
outboard motor be was attmpWc^x* 
lift onto a barrel. “Broke off the spark 
plug when it fell.”

There are problems with flats on 
the bicycle tires of his chair. Anyone 
who has attempted to ride a bicycle, 
or wheel chair, in pastures or yards 
where there are stickers knows they 
are unavoidable. “I just take them off 
and patch them," he explains the 
remedy.

Asked what he misses the most, in 
not being able to walk, Louis 
responded “Seeing people jogging. I 
wonder, at my age, what it would be 
like.”

Once, while taking therapy at 
Gonzales, he said he became 
depressed when he realized he was 
handicapped for life. But seeing 
others in his own, or even worse, 
predicament, plus the help of staff 
personnel in the clinic, helped him 
though that period.

Louis thinks little of being 
handicapped, nor has he allowed it to 
keep him from living a full and 
rewarding life. “I’ve got everything I 
need or could want. I’m happy,” be 
said.

For those who know Louis, that’s 
not a surprising observation by the 
wheel chair occupant who didn’t even 
know 1981 had been designated as the 
“International Year of the Handi­
capped.”

I
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B rya n t9 Blackwell rites read b y  bride 9s father Friday even in s
day evening  * * '  • "  • /  ™The Friday evening wedding of 

Miss Belinda Kay Bryant and 
Timothy Wayne Blackwell was 
keynoted by family sentiment when 
her father, who gave her in marriage 
for her parents, also officiated the 
double-ring ceremony, and brothers 
of the couple provided the vocal 
music.

The bride is the daughter of Rev. 
and Mrs. Fred Bryant of Wichita 
Falls, and the groom is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Paul G. Blackwell of Iowa 
Park. The Victory Baptist Church in 
Wichita Falls, where Rev. Bryant 
serves as pastor, was the setting for 
the wedding.

For the service, the altar of the 
church was decorated with a center 
archway traced with boxwood 
greenery. On either side were white 
tapers aglow in arch candelabra, and 
brass columns holding bouquets of 
yellow carnations, white daisies and 
purple statice. Aisle posts topped 
with candles and yellow bows marked 
the pews.

Prelude piano selections played by 
John Speed included one of his 
compositions, “3rd Movement of 
Mizpah," “Always,” “ Somewhere My 
Love,” “ A Time for Us." “Love 
Story,”  and “ Sunrise. Sunset.” He 
provided the accompaniment for 
“Walk Hand in Hand," a solo 
rendition by Paul T. Blackwell, twin 
brother of the groom, and another 
solo, “Can Two Walk Together?" by 
Marrion Bryant, brother of the bride. 
The pianist also accompanied the 
vocalists for a duet number, "Whither 
Thou Goest” and played the 
processional and recessional compo­
sitions.

MRS. TIMOTHY BLACKWELL

The bride carried a teardrop 
bouquet of spring flowers composed 
of white and yellow daisy poms, 
sweetheart roses, pixie carnations, 
purple statice and gypsophila to 
complement her formal white sheer 
organza gown adorned with lavish 
Venise lace trim.

Appliques of the lace graced the 
slightly raised bodice designed with a

Kim
Stan sb u ry
is now associated with

Merle's Beauty Shop

high lace neck, a V yoke outlined with 
tiny pleats and long fitted sleeves 
that terminated in ruffles at the 
wrists. The attraction of the full skirt 
was enhanced with a lace hem and 
three tiers of pleated ruffles that fell 
into a graceful chapel length train. 
The bride's chapel length veil of 
bridal illusion drifted from a 
lace-covered camelot cap.

She wore an heirloom pearl 
necklace for “something old,” pearl 
earrings that belonged to her sister, 
Miss Belva Bryant for “something 
borrowed," wore her gown and garter 
for “something new” and “something 
blue” and slipped a penny in her 
wedding slipper.

The maid of honor, bridesmaids and 
candlelighter were attired in yellow 
organdy gowns worn over yellow 
taffeta. In design, they featured 
ruffled front and back necklines, 
capelet sleeves, set-in waist bands, 
flared skirts, flounced hems secured 
at the back waistline with organza 
flowers. The attendants carried 
nosegays of yellow pixie carnations, 
purple statice and baby's breath, and 
the candlelighter wore a corsage of 
yellow pixie carnations and baby's 
breath.

Miss Belva Bryant, sister of the 
bride, served as maid of honor. 
Bridesmaids were Miss Tammie 
Shirley, Miss Sherlene McLendon and 
Miss Sharon Brandt of Oklahoma 
(Jity. Miss Karen Scarbrough lighted 
the candles for the ceremony.

The flower girl was Shannon 
Bryant, niece of the bride. She wore a 
floor length princess-style dress of 
yellow organza dotted swiss made 
with slightly raised waistline,

gathered skirt with a flounced 
hemline, ruffled neckline and puff 
sleeves. The mid-length ruffled 
overskirt accented with ruffled tiers 
of Venise lace swept up one side and 
was joined at the waistline with a bow 
of dotted swiss. She carried a white 
wicker basket holding yellow pixie 
carnations, daisies and baby's breath.

James and Chris Blackwell of 
Walters, Okla., cousins of the groom, 
carried the rings for the service. They 
were clad in classic white Eton suits 
with knee length pants.

Paul T. Blackwell, the groom’s twin 
brother, was his best man. 
Groomsmen were George Blackwell, 
another brother of the groom, Tony 
Franklin and Corky Scarbrough. 
Marrion G. Bryant, the bride’s 
brother, was assigned duties of 
ushering.

The groom wore three yellow roses 
mingled with leather leaf and baby's 
breath for a boutonniere with his 
^rhite Saxony tuxedo. The men who 
took part in the wedding were attired 
in brown summit tuxedos and light 
yellow shirts.

Mrs. Bryant, mother of the bride, 
chose a floor length dress of taupe 
sophisticate satin styled with V 
neckline bordered in Chantilly lace, 
high fitted bodice with contour­
shaped waistline. The dress was 
topped with a loose fitting galloon 
lace jacket with full length sleeves. 
Mrs. Blackwell, the groom's mother, 
wore a formal yellow silesta chiffon 
gown fashioned with a raised bodice. 
Queen Anne neckline, long sheer 
sleeves and accordion pleated skirt. 
On their shoulders, they wore

jg r m r r m r m ^ iT m m m T T i w m Trnnnni rm ~ m

Open House Tonight
(July 16)

7:00 p.m. to 9:00 p.m.

fe

592-4429 900 S. Colorado

ountry (Collections
cArl Qallery

Expw. 287 at Bell 592 5861

featuring 
June Cheek 
displaying 

Wholesale Jewelry 3
ju u u fl

corsages of yellow sweetheart roses 
and baby’s breath.

Preceding the couple's departure 
for a wedding trip to Dallas when the 
bride travelled in a two-piece yellow 
and white dress and wore a corsage of 
spring flowers, the bride’s parents 
honored them at a reception held in 
the Fellowship Hall of the church.

The oblong bride’s table, covered 
with white lace over yellow, was 
centered with a five-branched 
candelabrum draped with yellow and 
white carnations, purple statice and 
baby’s breath.

The four-tiered white cake, divided 
with three sets of columns decorated 
with lilies of the valley, was deftly 
frosted with trailing yellow roses on 
the sides and three rows of the roses 
around the base tier. The top 
ornament, a romantic design, 
featured a trellis covered with lace 
and pearl-centered daisies that 
formed a background for two kissing 
cherubs.

The white napkins lettered in gold 
with “Tim and Belinda, July 10,1981” 
and the crystal punch service 
harmonized with the table decor.

The groom’s table was laid with a 
floral designed white lace cloth over 
yellow. It held the double-wedding 
bell-shaped chocolate cake, coffee 
service and two crystal baskets filled 
with yellow and white satin rice 
rosebuds.

Reception assistants were Mmes. 
Don Scarbrough, Phil Bess, Marrion 
Bryant and Miss Carol Wages.

The groom's parents were hosts for 
the rehearsal dinner at K-Bob’s Steak 
House. The tables were laid with

ivory lace cloths and decorated with 
spring bouquets and candles.

The newlyweds are both employed 
by B&W Sheet Metal & Roofing in 
Wichita Falls. She was graduated 
from Wichita Falls High School and 
he was graduated from Iowa Park 
High School.

The new Mrs. Blackwell was 
honored at two prenuptial showers.

Out-of-town wedding guests in­
cluded Mrs. Zona Buckley of 
Marietta, Okla., grandmother of the 
bride; Messrs, and Mrs. Tim Brandt 
and Jill, Gene Landrum, Bob Bryant, 
Mrs. Sally Roberts, all of Lawton, 
Okla.; Mr. and Mrs. Claud Crossland, 
Tony and Traci of Burneyville, Okla.

Birk Circle meets
Mrs. C.E. Birk was hostess for 

the Tuesday morning meeting of the 
Lucy Birk Circle of the First 
Presbyterian Church and for the 
salad luncheon that followed. Mrs. L. 
Shelton was the presiding officer.

Miss Titia Belle Blanks taught the 
Bible lesson. She was assisted by 
Mmes. Gale Lowrance, Norman 
Nettleton and Edna Lemond in 
helping to develop the topic, "Exalted 
Through Suffering.”

Miss Blanks stated that the 
remnant expressed their spiritual 
insight into the actual work of the 
Messiah as he performed it in his own 
suffering and, today, it is the believer 
who will be exalted because Christ 
suffered for him.

o o o o o o o o  m o o

Debbie 
Lou

has returned 
fu lltim e to

D ouble M  Beauty Salon
592-5815

:»U A J *«̂ *J****»** »4‘

2 0 8  J a m e s  
lOO oo< 592-4347

FOURTH ANNUAL
WICHITA COUNTY YOUNG FARMERS'

7:30 p.m. Friday — Saturday
Red River Rodeo Arena (FM 369)

FRIDAY EVENTS
5,500 Lb. Modified Tractors 
7,200 Lb. Modified Tractors 
5,800 Lb. Modified Trucks

— Adm ission —

SATURDAY EVENTS
7,500 Lb. Modified Tractors
9.200 Lb. Modified Tractors
6.200 Lb. Modified Trucks

$6 A d u lts 
*3 Ch ild ren

Box Seats Available

DON'T MISS ITU
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Trustees hire teachers, 
add baseball program

Several important topics were 
discussed and acted upon during the 
Holliday school board's regular 
meeting Monday night.

Three new teachers were hired, 
baseball was added to the high school 
athletic program for 1981-82, the 
board created additional responsibil­
ities and set salaries for five 
departmental heads in high school to 
be named later, and principals Dan 
Owen and Bill Lee were given 
additional responsibilities and salary 
increases.

Gordon L. Turner, an Iowa Park 
junior and senior high math teacher, 
was hired to teach high school math. 
Martha Kay Higgins, currently 
teaching in Corsicana, was hired to 
replace Annetta Reusch as high 
school English teacher, and Patty 
Schutle was hired to replace Connie 
York as elementary and high school 
librarian.

After much discussion concerning 
the pros and cons of initiating a new 
baseball program in Holliday, 
trustees voted to add baseball to the 
athletic program. Athletic director 
Don Lucy is to name the coaches and 
submit a budget proposal at the next 
meeting when trustees will set the 
school budget for the 1981-82 school 
year.

Six Holliday High School FFA 
members and their advisors will 
attend the state FFA convention 
Monday, Tuesday and Wednesday at 
the Dallas Convention Center.

This will be the first year a 
delegation from the newly-organized 
Holliday chapter will attend a state 
convention.

Lloyd C.'Kelly* Denny
Services tor lx>yd C. “Kelly” 

Denny, 80, were Monday morning in 
Tanner-Aulds Funeral Home. Rev. 
Hal Farnsworth, pastor of First 
Baptist Church officiated. Burial was 
in Highland Cemetery.

He was born Sept. 29, 1900, in the 
Valley View community. A lifelong 
resident of Wichita County, he was a 
retired employee of Wichita County 
and a member of First Baptist 
Church.

He married Jack Mathews Nov. 16, 
1924, in Holliday.

He is survived by his wife; a 
brother, Earle Denny; four sisters, 
Mrs. Maggie Burnett, Mrs. Lottie 
Lochridge, Mrs. Kathryn Ford and 
Mrs. Marie Callon, all of Iowa Park; 
and several nieces and nephews.

Pallbearers were Jesse McCul-

"L ife  consists in what a 
man is thinking of all day." 

Ralph Waldo Emerson

"The first duty of friendship 
is to leave your friend his 
illusions." Arthur Schnitzler

There was some concern that 
starting a baseball program in 
Holliday will spread the athletes too 
thin with the addition of baseball to 
track, golf and tennis in the spring. 
Holliday, Archer City and Millsap are 
the only schools in the district 
without a baseball program.

One trustee mentioned that several 
parents of Little League ball players, 
among others, have shown great 
interest in starting a program in the 
school.

High school principal Bill Lee 
submitted his recommendations upon 
request for the creation of five 
departmental head positions. The 
head of each department, to be named 
later, will be given $400 increase over 
present salary. A motion to amend 
the increase to $500 was voted down, 
with Larry Finnell and Durhl 
Caussey voting for, and Mrs. Alice 
Carver, Jack Ayres and Gene 
Harmon voting against the amend­
ment.

Elementary principal Dan Owen 
was named to supervise cafeteria and 
maintenance, and was given an 
increase of $2,331 over present 
salary. Lee was named to head the 
school’s transportation, and his salary 
period was extended from 10 to 11 
months, and $700 over present salary.

In other business, the vocational

Voting delegates will be Ricky Esco 
and Bubba Hester. Also attending 
will be Kristi Haney, secretary, 
Teresa Burks, treasurer, Cindy Lyles 
and Shami Northcott.

Vocational agriculture adviser Cal 
Gaulden and his assistant, Jim Bob 
Wallace, will be sponsors for the trip.

lough, James Whitaker, J.D. 
M o rr iso n , B u d  R e e d , D a le  B oh an n on  
and Bob Aulds.

Mrs. Joel Cathey
Services for Mrs. Joel (Wynell 

Edna) Cathey, 59, were held 
Wednesday morning at First Baptist 
Church, with Rev. Hal Farnsworth, 
pastor, officiating. Burial was in 
Highland Cemetery under direction 
of Tanner Aulds Funeral Home.

Mrs. Cathey, the daughter of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. L.C. Good, was 
born Nov. 8, 1921, in Clara. She 
married Joel Cathey Sept. 8, 1940. 
She was a nursery director at First 
Baptist Church.

She is survived by her husband of 
the home; a son, Dwight of Irving; a 
daughter, Mary of Wichita Falls; two 
brothers. Carvel Good of Electra and 
Carroll Good of Spearman.

Pallbearers were Buck Voyles, 
Walter Spruiell, Gordon Griffith, 
Eldon Thompson, Bud Mercer and 
Jim Adams.

agriculture budget was accepted as 
submitted by advisor Cal Gaulden, 
City National Bank of Wichita Falls 
was named bank depositor, and the 
student group insurance coverage 
was renewed.

The vocational agriculture budget, 
totalling $14,904, was accepted by the 
board. Major cost estimates in the 
budget are $4,000 for expendable 
supplies such as welding supplies, 
metal, wood, shop towels, cleaning 
fluid or solvents, $3,700 for teacher 
travel, and $2,000 for a covered stock 
trailer.

Don Talley of Talley Insurance 
acted as a consultant for the school in 
deciding which student group 
coverage to take. Heritage Insurance 
was accepted by the board. Rates for 
kindergarten through sixth grade are 
$12 for school hours only coverage, 
and $35 for 24-hour coverage. Rates 
for seventh through 12th grades and 
faculty, administration and non­
faculty personnel is $16 and $38. 
Rates for senior high football 
coverage is $45.

City National Bank was named as 
depositor for a period beginning Sept.
1 and ending Aug. 31, 1983.
Representing City National was Dean 
Swinney. Other banks bidding for 
depositor were State National Bank, 
represented by Bill Steger, and 
Parker Square Bank, represented by 
Tony Clark.

Earn top honors 
at Brownwood

Holliday Eagle Band drum major 
Ronald McDaniel and the Eagle Flag 
Corps received a division “I” rating in 
competition during the Howard 
Payne Flag Corps and Drum Major 
Camp in Brownwood recently.

McDaniel and the Eagle Flag Corps 
were one of 10 groups chosen out of 
34 of all classifications to receive the 
top rating for their performances.

Members of the Eagle Flag Corps 
include captains Deborah Noli and 
Charlotte Lewallen; Angie Addison, 
Teri Briggs, Sharon Hotaling, Leslie 
Mankins, Melissa Parish and Lisa 
Boyd.

Lawmakers enter 
special session

State Rep. Charles Finnell
returned to Austin Friday in 
preparation for the special legislative 
session which began Monday.

“One major issue facing us will be 
the drawing of the state's 27 
congressional districts to reflect the 
demographic changes reported in the 
1980 Census,” stated Finnell, “and 
another item of emergency nature 
will be the extension of the Medical 
Practice Act, which includes
provisions for the licensing and
regulation of the state’s physicians.”

Other topics to be considered in 
this special session are repeal of the 
state ad valorem tax, the creation of a 
water trust fund from surplus state 
revenues, and revision of the
property tax code approved in 1979.

Under the Texas Constitution, a 
special session is limited to 30 days in 
which to address the topics proposed 
by the governor.

F F A  d r i n j S l M  f t *  t o  f r t m | |

Obituaries

LUNCHEON BUFFET
ALL YOU CAN EAT

Monday through Friday 
11:00 a.m. -1:30 p.m.

P izza , Sp ag h etti,
R igatoni & Buffet

Complete Salad Bar W ith Over 35 Items

------------------------------------------------------- $
FREE TEA WITH BUFFET

July 16*22 Only

k e n ’s. nzzB
592-4184 920 W est H ighw ay

PER
PERSON

JOHN WILSON t

Hollidsy men

John Wilson of Holliday was 
elected recently as regional vice 
president for the Texas Association of 
Realtors.

Active in real estate in Wichita 
Falls since graduating from Mid 
western State Univ. in 1972, Wilson 
has served in several capacities with 
the Wichita Falls’ Board of Realtors. 
He was named Multiple Listing 
Service chairman in 1976, president 
of the Board of Realtors in 1977, and 
Realtor of the Year in 1978.

Wilson is also active in civic affairs, 
serving as Board of Commerce and 
Industry Gold Coated Ambassador, 
and as deacon at Tenth and Broad 
Church of Christ.

Wilson and his wife Linda have two 
sons, Stephen and Shannon. He is the 
son of Mrs. R.R. Wilson and the late 
R. R. Wilson of Harrold.

"Old friends are best. King 
James used to call for his 
old shoes; they were easiest 
for his feet." John Seldon

GOLFERS
M»» *• SmT*-  ** *****

&REENFEES
S3.00 WHX OATS- 
W OO SATUWATS 

SUNDAYS AND NOUOATS
Public Welcome*- 
CampM* rro Shop-Fnciliihti

RALPH MORROW
Golf Professional 

(lottooi hy Appoptmort)

SYU N E ( X .
N.Beverly Ph.855-0771

Street resurfacing, 
police salary 

highlight meting
Holliday city council Monday 

night set new police chief Lomax 
Campbell’s salary and discussed 
resurfacing approximately two miles 
of streets.

After meeting in executive session 
to discuss personnel and the 
right of way project on Highway 277, 
council returned to open session 
before setting Campbell’s salary at 
$1,250 per month.

Discussion of the right-of-way 
project included setting an 
estimate of cost to obtain a channel 
easement on approximately two and 
three fourth acres owned by B.W. 
Stone.

According to city administrator 
Jim Hamill, independent appraisals 
have already been made, and mayor 
James Cook, precinct commissioner 
Yvonne Carter and a representative 
of the Highway Department will meet 
with Stone to work out a settlement.

Street resurfacing was discussed, 
and Hamill was instructed to meet

with Mrs. Carter and work out 
arrangements with Archer County to 
pave approximately two miles of 
streets. In past agreements, the city 
supplied the materials, while the 
county supplied labor and equipment.

In other business, liability and 
firemen’s insurance was renewed 
through St. Paul Insurance Co. of 
Arlington, represented by Don Talley 
of Talley Insurance, at a cost of 
$5,448.

In addition, council tentatively 
agreed to tap an eight-inch water line 
at Randy Shanks’ residence across 
from Jeter's Liquor Store; asked 
dump ground operator Pete Snyder 
to attend the next council meeting to 
discuss modifying dump ground 
hours; and by voice approval decided 
to work with Roy C. Ling in laying a 
six-inch water line across FM 368 to 
Old State Road for a present 
residence and with potential 
development in the future.

J 48" light or dark 
1 wooden blades 

Reversable 
Variable Speeds

$9995Brown
Only

Light as low as $15.95

V I D E O  C A R E
N «xt to T G « Y  in Ih a  Shopping C e n tw

L  Phon. 592-5552

PLUMLEE EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICE INC
1404 1 1th S tree t 

W ich ita  Falls, Texas 76301 
(817) 3 2 2 -5 5 6 0  

E m ergency N um ber 911

To help keep the cost of ambulance service down, and to upgrade our service to Advanced 
Life Support System (ALSS) which would allow your City and County to have Paramedics on our 
ambulances; Plumlee Emergency Medical Service, Inc. is offering to the residents of the cities and 
county with which we have contracted, a membership program for ambulance service.

This program is for Emergency and Doctor ordered ambulance service to Wichita General 
Hospital and Bethania Hospital only. Transfers and non-emergency ambulance service will remain 
the same.

At this time, the base rate for ambulance service to the hospital is $65.00. The base rate for 
service from the hospital is $55.00 plus $1.50 per loaded mile.

However, if you become a member, you will join at a rote of $50.00 for a single membership 
(individual) or $65.00 for a family of four (including two dependents under the age of 18 living 
with you). If you have more than two dependents living with you, there will be an additional charge 
of $10.00 for each dependent. There is no limit on the number of emergency or doctor ordered 
calls you may have during the year.

t As a member, you will be charged 75C per loaded mile instead of the regular price of $1.50 
per loaded mile. We would still have to charge for supplies that are used during the call.

If you have Medicare or other insurance that would pay the ambulance charge, as a member 
we will file one claim so that you could be reimbursed for your membership fee.

For transfers to other hospitals, as a member you would be charged one half the regular cost 
of the transfer.

In order for this membership to be made available, we must have a minimum of 15,000 
members. All memberships that are received will be put in escrow and at the end of the deadline, If 
our goal has not been reached, your money will be refunded.

This membership is for one year at a time. Deadline to join is JUL 3 1 19Q1__________
Please complete the membership application below. Make all checks payable to PLUMLEE 
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICE, INC.

Thank you.

N AM E _________
M A ILIN G  ADDRESS  
CITY & STATE _____

A G E
PH O N E

Z IP
List sp o u se  an d  ch ild re n  u n d e r 18 a t  h o m e

5
A G f AOI

AG* AOI

*50.00s in g le  $10.00additional m e m b e rs
*65.00fa m ily  m em b ersh ip  T o ta l

DATE

Membership Applications Accepted By Phone 322-5S6o"

♦
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Dana Hicks delegate to seminar
According tn r —.jAccording to Vt*a n  

president of WichiU C o u n t ^ ^ " '  
Bureau, Dana Hicks of I o ^ P . i ^ ™ !
Terry M .y of B u r k b ^ t
attending the Texas Z  **
High School S tu d e n ts^ ,-  UT U 
Seminar in Waco July 20-24 Sh‘P 

Miss Hicks, daughter of .  j  
Mr#. Ray Hicks of low# P#r, wtlt ^
* r . ^ r “ iow* p" ‘ Hw s . h ^ t a
the fall. She is a member of the IPH«?^ w k ^ A c .

Club, and Iowa Park 4-H Club Dana
is presently vice-president of th l
,p HS Future Farmers
and Area IV first vice-president. She
wdl receive the Lone Star Farmer
Degree this month at the State FFA
Convention.

May is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
May of Burkburnett. He is a member 
of the Burkburnett High School 
Future Farmers of America and won 
the showmanship award at the 
Burkburnett Junior Livestock Show

this past year. Terry is very active in 
4-H work and is President of the 
Friberg-Cooper 4-H Club. He will 
represent Wichita County in 
Washington, D.C. at the National 4-H 
Citizenship Shortcourse and Heritage 
Tour this summer.

The purpose of the Farm Bureau 
Seminar is to convey to the students a 
better understanding of our Ameri­
can heritage and the capitalistic 
private enterprise system.

The ultimate goal, in addition to 
being better informed, is to cause the 
students to want to share their 
information with others. Therefore, 
after their return from the seminar, 
the youths will be available to speak 
to area civic groups.

Municipal Court 

Records

Wendell Lee Miser, speeding, $51.50; 
Mark Alton Patterson, speeding, 
$51.50;
Donald Heath Bamber, speeding, 
$30.50;
Dennis Lee Fox, speeding, $32.50; 
James G. Peabody, speeding, $35.50; 
Jimmy Dale Combs, speeding, 
$30.50;
Wanda Duren, allowing dog to run at 
large, $28.50.

Physicals due Aug. 1
Head football coach David 

Baugh this week issued a reminder 
that all high school athletes intending 
to try out for football this fall must 
have their physicals completed by 
Aug. 1.

Forms to be filled out are available 
at Park Clinic. Those who wish to 
have their physicals taken elsewhere

should obtain forms either at the 
fieldhouse or Baugh's home.

High school football players will be 
issued their shoes Aug. 5, and 
commence two-a-day workouts Aug. 
10, according to the head mentor.

Members of the coaching staff will 
attend the state coaching school next 
week in Dallas.

Lara Rochau, 10 year-old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ray Rochau 
of 601 W. Manes, Iowa Park, placed 
first in three events and second in 
another Saturday at the regional 
competition of the Texas Amateur 
Athletic Federation in WichiU Falls.

Miss Rochau placed first in the 
girls’ 10 and under 50-meter, 
100-meter and 200-meter dashes. She 
also placed second in the long jump. 
The meet was held at WichiU Falls 
High School track.

Joining Miss Rochau from Iowa 
Park at the state meet in Laredo July 
31 Aug. 1 will be Jan and Brett Hale, 
who placed in their respective 
distance races.

-WELCOME- 
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

S. Yosemite 
9:45 S.S./7P.M. 

Wed. 7 P.M. Service 
Rev. Charles Hensley, 

Pastor
vvvCvvvvvvvvvvj^v

DANA HICKS

FIRST
CHRISTIAN

CHURCH
[Disciples of Christ]

Rev. Clyde Markee 
105 E. Cash 592^513 
You are cordially invited 
to worship with us each 
Sunday.
Church School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:55 a.m. 

YOUTH PROGRAM
6-00 p.m.

Kam ay Road 
Church of Christ

Corner of Colorado 
A Emerald

‘Seeking the
Old Paths’

Lord’s Day 
10:30 a.m. & 6 p.m. 

Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

D airy
Queen

Serving the Lord 
with Gladness

Faith Baptist 
Church
411 S. Wall

Sunday School 9:45
Worship 11:00
Training Union 6:00
Evening Worship 7:00
Prayer Service 7:30

Ken dole, Paator

Call-In Orders, Phone

592-4811
505 W.

Southwest Expressway
Open 10 a.m. - Q p.m. Daily

TACO
BURGER

$ | 2 9

f

Welcome To The 
Worship and Fellowship of

First Presbyterian Church
Norman D . Nettleton, Pastor 

CHURCH SCHOOL - 9:45 A.M.
FELLOWSHIP Time • 10:40 A.M.
MORNING WORSHIP - 11:00 A.M.

211  So. Yosemite

Christ The King
Catholic Church

8:15 A.M. Sundays 
7 :0 0  P.M. C.C.D. & Bible Study 

Meetings held at Good Sheperd Lutheran Church 
____________  ■ First and Magnolia.

Grace Baptist Church
511 S. Colorado - 592-5632

Come Let Us Reason Together Saith The Lord 
Sunday School...10:00 A.M.

Morning Worship...tl:00 A.M.
Evening Worship...6:30 P.M.

Wednesday Service...7:30 P.M.
Jimmy Johnson, Pastor

------Special Through Wednesday

The DUDE
(S teak  Sandw ich)

$ | 4 5

BEAN DAY Every WEDNESDAY
Compliments and Complaints Welcomed.

Why gas is so efficient:

IOW A PARK  
CHURCH OF CHRIST

SCHEDULE OF SERVICES
Wednesday 

Ladies Bible Study 
Evening Study

10:00 a.m 
7:30 p.m

Sunday
Bible Study 9:90 a.m.
Worship 10:90 uju.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.

* Study the Bible in the privacy of your own home. Write for a FREE Bible 
Correspondence Course and enrich your life: Church of Christ, P.0. Box 
520, Iowa Park, Texas 76367

• Keep !■ Touch: 592 2541... s short devotional and information relative to 
members of the congregstion. Information changed daily.

300  East Park, Iowa Park, Texas 76367, [817)592-5415 
L. KEITH PARKER, PREACHER

Natural Energy
Natural gas works for you in its original 
form It's a natural fuel, not manufac­
tured energy And the most efficient way 
to use it is in the form nature created 
You'll save energy, save money, by 
making direct use of gas to heat your

home, heat water, dry clothes and cook 
And Lone Star can deliver all the gas 
you need for your home. It's another 
good reason to be glad you're served by 
the Lone Star system

Gas. It’s plentiful,efficient and right for the times.

Lone Star Gas Company



PAGE 12, IOWA PARK LEADER, IOWA PARK, TEXAS, JULY 16, 1981

Riley Thompson gave an 
interesting program on one of his 
several hobbies, that of barb wire
collecting, for the Evening Lions Club 
Tuesday.

He said that the need for farmers to 
separate their grazing lands in the 
U.S. became apparent around 1840 
and that by 1850 barb wire was being

d riv e
. . .

L
Texas

Department ot Public Safety

m b ’ s  p r o g r a m
manufactured in 111. and sent west. 
He sa»d that eventually each rancher 
had his own particular type of wire 
and that today there were more than 
100 different kinds.

Thompson displayed about 36 
different types of the wire that he has 
in his collection and gave the 
members and guests a stick of Brinks 
2 Twist patented April 8, 1878, for a 
souvenir.

Jim Spears was received into the 
club as a new member and guests 
were Mmes. Sam Hunter, E.E. Wallis 
and Riley Thompson.

Thursday, July 30
KING SIZE . 
WALLET 

CREATIVE 
COLOR 

PORTRAITS 
FOR ONLY

Kodak paper For a Good Look at the Times 
of Your Life. t m

Extra V 
Charge 

for
GROUPS

GET PICTURES MADE OF GNAN0PA GAAN0MA DAO MOM
AND AIL THE LITTLE ONES AT THESE SAME LOW PRICES'

ASK
About Our

8 X 10 
OFFER

U S E  KODAK P A P E R

i o n  PHOTOS

W H ITES

1 555 i
1

KERN RAILSBACK

Kcnlaibbaek 
e a r n  master’s

Kern Railsback, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Railsback, will receive a 
master of music degree at 7 p.m. 
Friday during summer commence­
ment exercises held in Truett 
Auditorium on the campus of 
Southwestern Baptist Theological 
Seminary in Fort Worth. President 
Russell Dilday, Jr., will confer 
degrees on 155 graduates.

A graduate of Iowa Park High 
School, he received a B.M. degree 
from Baylor University at Waco, and 
is currently serving as minister of 
music and youth at the First Baptist 
Church in Electra.

His wife, the former Barbara 
Curry, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Curry of Iowa Park, is a teacher in 
the Electra school system.

WHISNAND c0o oi m  
REALTORS

Full Tim e Professionals

108 L  W ashington
•  2 Bedrooms
•  1 Va Baths
•  3-Car garage
•  Kitchen built-ins
•  On five lots

•  Garage

RURAL ACREAGE
6.5 Acres, cleared and fenced. Irrigation ditch adjoins. 

Located between Peterson and Bridwell Rds., south of FM 367

900 W est Highway
in the same building with Barbour Insurance

•  Finance FmHA if you 
qualify, or FHA

L.S. WHISNAND 
Broker 

592-2365

BOBBY WHISNAND 
Manager 
592 2413

DONNA WELLS 
Sales Representative 

592 9574

b il l y  l . McDo n a l d
Sales Representative 

592-1338

713 S. W all
•  3 Bedrooms
•  1 Va Baths

For A Quick Sale - Call Us • We Buy Equities

Microwave cooking 
workshop slated

A free microwave cooking 
workshop will be sponsored July 23 at 
the Texas Electric Reddy Room here.

Sponsored by Texas Electric, 
Debbie Walker, home economist, will 
speak on "Energy efficiency micro- 
wave cooking.”

It will begin at 7:30 p.m.

CARD OF THANKS
My family joins me in thanking 

all of our friends for the many acts of 
kindness shown me during my recent 
stay in the hospital. Your prayers, 
gifts, cards and flowers were a real 
source of encouragement and made 
me realize anew that friends really 
care. Thank you very much.

Harry Brott

CARDOFTHANKS
Argie and Jo Ann Gould join me 

in expressing sincere thanks to the 
marvelous police department for the 
outstanding assistance rendered July 
2 when my three-year-old son was 
bitten by a rattlesnake. I would also 
like to publicly express my good 
fortune in having such a wonderful 
neighbors like the Goulds, who are 
always around in time of need.

Pat Ritter

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank everyone 

who helped us through the recent loss 
of our beloved Cleo. Your prayers, 
food and flowers are greatly 
appreciated. Your love and support 
have done much to sustain us through 
the past few weeks. We are grateful 
for your help in this time of sorrow.

The C.A. Nipper Family

ABOUT TOWN
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Frazier will 

return today from a week's trip to 
Hawaii where they went to celebrate 
their 25th wedding anniversary. They 
were accompanied by her sister and 
husband. Mr. and Mrs. Mike Negri of 
Decatur who celebrated their 14th 
wedding anniversary.

Schedule for:

Recreational
A-ctivities

Center
Thursday - funtime, 9 a.m. to 

noon; open until 6 p.m.; RAC board of 
directors to meet at 7:30 p.m.

Friday - funtime, 9 a.m. to noon; 
open until 6 p.m.

Saturday • open 1 to 5 p.m.
Sunday - closed.
Monday - closed.
Tuesday - funtime, 9 a.m. to noon; 

open until 6 p.m.; ceramics, 7:30 p.m.
Wednesday - funtime, 9 a.m. to 

noon; open until 6 p.m.; craft time for 
schoolagers. 1:30 p.m.

Water color workshop Aug. 6-7 8.

Grand jury indicts 
former resident

A former low . P * rk «

Wednesday { T S ^ w S d U  County

^George^L. Teel was charged with 
aggravated perjury, habitual posses 
fon o f controlled substance, 

marijuana, and possession with intent 
Z  deliver a controlled substance.
amphetamines.

Younts geese taken
Eight young geese were 

reportedly taken from the Paul Miller 
home Saturday.

The residence, located on the 
extreme east end of Bogan Acres, 
was reportedly visited between 7:30 
and 8:30 p.m. Saturday and the geese, 
valued at $12, taken.

KING'S KIDS
CHRISTIAN DAY CARE 

& PRE-SCHOOL
7owa Park's Finest For Parents Who Care 

______________392-4242 _________

ENROLL NOW
Fall 1981

Pre-School Program
Beginning Aug. 31

A g es2f3 ,4 & 5
Parents - Come in for a visit

PUBLIC NOTICE
SHERIFFS SALE 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
County of Wichita

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That by virtue of a certain 
Order of Sale issued out of the Honorable 89th District Court 
of Wichita C.ounty, on the 6th day of July 1981 by Wayne 
Wiggins. Clerk of said 89th District Court for the sum of 
Seven  T h o u sa n d  N in e  H u n d red  T h irty  and 0 8 /100
DOLLARS and costs of suit at 9% per annum from the date 
of Judgment under a certain judgment, in favor of Iowa Park 
Consol. Independent School District, City of Iowa Park and 
Wichita County Improvement District No. 3, Plaintiffs and 
Wichita County, State of Texas, Wichita County Water 
Improvement District 83, Plaintiffs and Wichita County, 
State of Texas, Wichita County Water Improvement 
District #2, Impleaded Defendants, in a certain cause in said 
Court, No. 35,828-C and styled Iowa Park Consol. 
Independent School District, City of Iowa Park and Wichita 
County, State of Texas and Wichita County Water 
Improvement District No. 2, Impleaded Defendants and 
placed in my hands for service, I John F. Gibson as Sheriff of 
Wichita County, Texas, did, on the 7th day of July 1981 levy 
on certain Real Estate, situated in Wichita County, Texas, 
described as follows, to-wit:

1) Property Number 286G02-007-0033-F-000 Garden 
Valley II, Block 7, Lots 33-46-No Street Addresses ***1002 
Dr. 555 (Amount of Judgment-$3552.17 plus the cost of suit - 
$56.17(

2) Property Number 286-G02-009-0012-F-000 Garden 
Valley II, Blk. 9, Lots 12-24 No Street Addresses 1002 DR 
555 (Amount of Judgment-$2453.83 plus the cost of suit •
$56.17(

3) Property Number 286-G02-010-0007 F-000 Garden 
Valley II, Blk. 10, Lots 8-16 No Street Addresses 1002 DR 
555 (Amount of Judgment-$1924.08 plus the cost of Suit -
$56.17)

NOTE: “A BIDDER AT THE SALE MUST BE 
REGISTERED AT THE TIME THE SALE BEGINS WITH 
THE SHERIFF. DEPUTY SHERIFF. OR AGENT
CONDUCTING THE SALE.”

and levied upon as the property of Thomas Lewis, and that 
on the first Tuesday in August 1981, the same being the 4th 
day of said month, at the Court House door, of Wichita 
County, in the City of Wichita Falls, Texas, at the hour of 10 
A.M. by virtue of said levy and said Order of Sale I will sell 
said above described Real Estate at public vendue, for cash, 
to the highest bidder, as the property of said Thomas Lewis, 

And in compliance with law, I give this notice by 
publication, in the English language, once a week for three 
consecutive weeks immediately preceding said day of sale, in 
the Iowa Park Leader a newspaper published in Wichita 
County.

Witness my hand, this 7th day of July 1981
John F. Gibson 

Sheriff, Wichita County, Texas 
By /a / Rodney B. Ney, Deputy.
Rodney B. Ney, Deputy Sheriff

SHERIFFS SALE 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

County of Wichita
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That by virtue of a certain 

Order of Sale issued out of the Honorable 78th District Court 
of Wichita County, on the 6th day of July 1981 by Wayne 
Wiggins, Clerk of said 78th District Court for the sum of 
Ninty-nine and 65/100 DOLLARS and costs of suit, 9% per 
annum from the date of judgment under a certain judgment, 
in favor of Iowa Park Consol. Independent School District, 
City of Iowa Park, plaintiffs and Wichita County, State of 
Texas and Wichita County Water Improvement District No. 
2, Impleaded Defts. in a certain cause in said Court, No. 
35,625-B and styled Iowa Park Consol. Independent School 
District and City of Iowa Park VS Glen D. Harwell, 
Defendant; Wichita County, State of Texas and Wichita 
County Water Improvement District No. 2, Impleaded 
Defendants and placed in my hands for service, I John F. 
Gibson as Sheriff of Wichita County, Texas, did, on the 7th

day of July 1981 levy on certain Real Estate, situated in 
Wichita County, Texas, described as follows, to-wit:

1) Property Number 286-F01-000-0000-F-000 All Property 
in Blk 1, Ferguson Subdivision owned by Glen Harwell - 400 
Lucy Birk/Burk Royalty

NOTE: "A BIDDER AT THE SALE MUST BE 
R EG ISTERED  A T  THE TIME THE  SALE  BEGINS W ITH  
THE SHERIFF, DEPUTY SHERIFF OR AGENT 
CONDUCTING THE SALE.”

and levied upon as the property of Glen D. Harwell, and that 
on the first Tuesday in August 1981, the same being the 4th 
day of said month, at the Court House door, of Wichita 
County, in the City of Wichita Falls, Texas, at the hour of 10 
A.M. by virtue of said levy and said Order of Sale I will sell 
above described Real Estate at public vendue for cash, to the 
highest bidder, as the property of said Glen D. Harwell.

And in compliance with law, I give this notice by 
publication, in the English language, once a week for three 
consecutive weeks immediately preceding said day of sale, in 
the Iowa Park Leader a newspaper published in Wichita

Witness my hand, this 7th day of July 1981
John F. Gibson 

Sheriff, Wichita County, Texas 
By /s /  Rodney B. Ney, Deputy.
Rodeny B. Ney, Deputy Sheriff

SHERIFFS SALE 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

County of Wichita
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN That by virtue of a certain 

Order of Sale issued out of the Honorable 89th District Court 
of Wichita County, on the 6th day of July 1981 by Wayne 
Wiggins, Clerk of said 89th District Court for the sum of One 
Thousand Six Hundred Eighty-Two and 29/100 DOLLARS 
and costs of suit, at 9% per annum from the date of 
judgment under a certain judgment, in favor of Iowa Park 
Consol. Independent School District and City of Iowa Park, 
Wichita County, State of Texas and Wichita County Water 
Improvement District No. 2 /Plaintiffs/ in a certain cause 
No. 35.623C and styled Iowa Park Consol. Independent 
School District and City of Iowa Park /Impleaded 
Defendants/ VS B.B. Gill and Mary Gill, Defendant; Wichita 
County, State of Texas and Wichita County Water 
Improvement District No. 2, Impleaded Defendants and 
placed in my hands for service, I John F. Gibson as Sheriff of 
Wichita County, Texas, did, on the 7th day of July 1981 levy 
on certain Real Estate, situated in Wichita County, Texas 
described as follows, to-wit:

1) Property Number 286-W02034^)000 F-001 WVF Lands 
Blk. 34, Tr. 1,84.27 Ac. ***834 Dr 95 NOTE: Located on FM 
Road 258 outside of Kamay. Wichita County, Texas.

THE SHERIFF, DEPUTY 
CONDUCTING THE SALE.”

otlEKlFF OR

Wichita County, in the City of Wichita Falls, Tei 
hour of 10 A M. by virtue of said levy and said On 
I will sell said above described Real Estate at publ

publication, in th ^ E rg b lh ^ a n ^ e ! m m V w M l
th e^ w a 'p ark * !^ i™mediately Preceding said da) 
County. Le*der * newspaper published i

Witness my hand, this 7th day of July 1981
John

By /V  Rodney B. N „ .  D e p ^ ' ^  
Rodney B. Ney, Deputy Sheriff
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BUY. SEIL.TRADE OB RENT THROUGH THE

d ead lin es  

10 A.M. WEDNESDAY(Word Adj Only)
4 P M. TUESDAY. DISPLAY ADS

DIAL 592-4431
SAVE 5' FIRST INSERTION BY PAYING WITH COPY

RATES:
16‘ PER WORD FIRST INSERTION 
8‘ PER WORD EACH REPEAT

# HOM ES F O R  S A L E
ion HALE Now brick
VP„ci'r home, a bedroom, 
IV, ImthM. double garagn. 
,215 mi R living »rcn. 144 

ft in K«r"Ke. 710 W.
,U i  143,000. Call Hill 
ci,.u,-r, Nchool Tax Office,
giaMTJt- 0 IH Ifc
owni:k f in a n c e d  a
licilrniiiii. I*rirk I Vi bathe,
ItiuTicn den comb. Nice 
fltfigt building. 7io w. 
Mmic* l<ow down payment.
m  M»39

7 10 lip

OWNER ANXIOUS 
2 Itonulllnl
Hpnnmli 1 bedroom. 2 
liiiln, formal living, 
dining. "cparele den, 
braotiful fireplace. Ap 
lirnulmately 2,400 square 
M  in home, with ninny 
ultra feature* ('nil after 
5 p m 692 7080 Jo Ann 
lluffnkt'r, Century 21 
Dnvnfken & Associates.

y r r r r m .x r o .x i

NKW LISTING Three I 
hwlrooma, !»' K«' liv in g
room, hath. Nice carpet, 
lovely paneling. • ecre of 
taad, t9t,BOO
I WO THOUSAND feel I
ol luminous benuly m l 
I In* tliter lii'iltoom brick  | 
home Klreplare, **|>rtnk 
In syslt’in C n v n W  | 
patio, two ear garage

5 two ear rear entry park 
Iny also This ami mncli | 
more

HliHINF.N.S Opportunity. | 
Holliday, Teiaa. 6 Apia, 
lor ihonlMy rentals T w o  I 
one nijfht rent ala. lo v e ly  
home for manager or 
owner on the property . 
Iloolii available to in te r 
evleil party $70,000

•I ACHES of choice | 
properly. Ideal for conn 
by home Could lx'1 
divided into four n ice | 
i*rKe building aitea

IIIIIFF IIEDKOOMS.
Imlh, very at t ract ive 
■tarter home Nice car 
pel llaa keen com pletely 
repainted recently. Can 

assumed. $22,000.

U .in  NICK upsta irs
lionic 1'hree bedroom*. 
livinKruoni. dining ami 
hilchen combination, 
vnlh built m range Hot 
lom ^'“ 'r beautifully 
decorated for small bus 
mess Ow ner w ill finance. . 
■ow. low interest, up to 

years.

tiirkk b e d r o o m s .
•»lb. large hvitigroom, 
dtchen dining room  
coiiibination Owner fi 
banring available Gvxxl 
•wighborhood

»dHM> BUSINESS Uva
*'"n >n Holliday Owner 
w'*l finance with k*w 
interest Plenty of park 
*nK *rva,

s»’ VC10lS BRICK home |
m beautiful corner lot- 
*uRv family room. Good | 

»**umption.

4SSIM ARLE 3 bed i 
r" '"" l '«  baths, large
r°r,'cr k>t. fenced back 
ârd- range, garage. Nice | 

"cighborhvxxi $26,500.

PAT C ARTER 
Ndes Vuxtialr 

593-Ml 7

MEMBER
Multiple lirtaec

JOHNNY LEE
Re a l  e s t a t e

1 «  W ee* Cask
592 237*

* «u *m  home, 
furnished, set up at Country
Y !?* K"U U "- m b  4400, i»nfl 1 1 1,4 f

r, vi i f ,

" • ‘ w a i v a . - .• IJHHI a UK,nth nr leaa
would you like to live in n 
!" "v 3 bedroom, | •/, |,#th 
I'ouse, Full carpeted with 
•'eol rnl heat/air, with ex 
5 1 " * ^  J«" payments,
H!y » .N IN STRU CTION  
COMPANY, (192 8788.

7 10 tfc

£  MISC. FOR SALE
g a r a g e  h a l e  1001
Uanelle, Thursilay only. 
Starts »» a.hi.

7 10 lip

GARAGE HALE 205 H.
Colorado, Thursday. Friday
Saturday.

7 10 Up

GAIt AGI'! HALE 109 James, 
Friday th Saturday, 8:30 to ? 
Clothes, sewing machine, 
P«tty chair, clothes hamper, 
cr«H'k pot, and much more.

7 10 ltp

GARAGE HALE Thursilay 
only. Unity clothes, chair, 
lols of miscellaneous. 410 S. 
Pacific, dead end W. 
Lafayette St.

7 10 ltp

YARD HALE 8 to 5
Thursday, Friday. Haby and 
children's clothing; 2 inch 
electric water pump; many 
other items. 710 E. Park.

7 10 Up
0 4 1 1 :■«»i r t / i i i,4|i.a 
YARD HALE Thursday. 
Friday. Saturday, 108 James 
Ur. 8:30 I ill ? Haby clothes, 
furniture. appliances,
clothes, what note, leys and 
mite.

7 10 Up

GARAGE SALE Corner of 
Roll Rd. and I'M 867, Fri. H, 
Sat.. 8 am. 5 pm . Good 
quality clothing Including 
jeans, all sixes. Honutiful 
girls formal*. Like new 
vent a hood; T V. sets, one 
in maple cabinet; Seats for 
bass boat; Avon bottle*; 
antique bottles.

7 16 ltp

RIG GARAGE SALE King 
sixe mattress. SAW port 
able TV. men's, women*, 
children & infants clothes, 
piny p*n, infant $winj* 
much, much more. I'hur., 

’ Fri. A Sat. 9 to 5. 107 Wood 
Circle. 1 block west of 
Kidwell Elem. 502 2487.

7 16 Up

3 Bedroom brick. 2 full 
bath*, double garA^t'.
largt' shop* acijoining 
lots may be bought with 
home. This is a beautiful 
home.

ENERGY EFFICIENT 
all the way. New root
carpeted, fenced. •*«•> 
lent condition. A 
house. Stove and reftig 
era tor remain.

VACANT IOT with slab 
and plumbing on Hughes 
St.. Wichita Falla

592-1348
SHIRLEA R-AlNs
r e a l k s t a w

U I W . M  lew.IHrk

GARAGE HALE three 
family, many useful items 
priced to soli. 610 N. Wall, 
Thura. Frl„ 8 4.

7 16 Up

PATIO HALE Thursday, 
Friday, 917 Van Horn.

7 16 Up

APT. SIZE washer and 
dryer, lilack naugahyde 
hide a bed. Phone 592 4862, 
592 24tl8 after 5.

7 16 Up

FOR HALE I pr. knee high 
rubber boots also It) $10.00;
I pr. 4 buckle overshoes size
II $15.00; 1 pr. insulated 
coveralls size 46 I all $30.00. 
Call 592 2055 or see at 519 
W. Aldlne St.

7 16 Up

FOR HALE Two good lawn 
mowers, good gas edger, 
small trailer special built 
for rilling lawn mower. 523 
West Magnolia, Phone 
592 5079.

7 16 Up

CANTALOUPES for sale. 3 
for $ 1.00, some 50c each, 
some for 75c each. 2nd house 
S. of F.xprenaway on Hell 
Hoad.

7 16 ltp

BALDWIN acrosonic spinet 
piano. Just like new,
ranch style cabinet. Paid 
$2400. will take l*eat offer.
592 9000.

7 16 ltp

1968 WELLCRAFT boat, 
with 55 hp Kvinrude motor. 
Seals need recovering.
$L2(K>. 592 9049 "  ’ '

7 14 ltc

SHAW’S
SPECIALS

•78 LTD 4 door. $2,295 

•78 LTD 4 dtxir $2,795 

"80 Granada 4 door $6,495

78 Datsun Pickup $3,995

79 Ford Pickup $4,695

77 Chevrolet 2 door.
$2,995

78 Ford Pickup $3,795

79 Ford IVkup $5,295

78 T Bird $3,795

79 Maxda $4,195

79 Chev. Chovotte $3,995

78 Granada I door $3,995

79 Podge Magnum 2
door $4,995

78 Granada 2 door $4,295

73 Courier $1,595

■90 (Hd* 2 dvxu $6,995

75 lKxtge IVkup $2,095

76 Hernia SW $2,195

74 CAC Ford $2,754.1

75 M a v e ric k  2 door
$2,195

Several other makes ami 
models to ch,xv*e front. . .

Slum Motor
6 G 0  U  . H ig h w tt i

1966 MUSTANG, 6 cylinder, 
automatic, factory air, pow 
er steering. A very straight 
car. 592 9006.

7 16 ltp

FOR HALE one lot in Iowa 
Park. 534 2034, 268-2826.

6 18 Htc

77 GMC Pickup. Half ton, 
LWH, 350, automatic, air, 
tilt wheel, clean, two tone 
yellow. Excellent condition, 
$3,300 or best offer. Call 
592 6039,

6 18 tfc

LARGE CORNER LOT with 
slabs for home and garage 
workshop. 5127 Kahuma, 
Wichita Falla. Assume 10% 
loan. Call 592 5444 or 
691 0255, evenings.

3 19 tfc

^  HOME SERVICES
LOLA’S PLAYSCHOOL has
openings for all day 
pre schoolers. Also taking 
registration for fall session 
of Head Start program. A 
working mother's dream. All 
day care and school for one 
fee. 7 a.m. to 6 p.m. Call 
592 2377.

7-18 3tp

REGISTERED Babysitter. 
Will keep infanta, small 
children. Monday Friday 
days or nights for working 
mothers. 592 9617.

7 16 ltp

BABYSITTING Licensed 
Grandmother. lx>ts of TLC, 
nice fenced in play area. 
Good meals. Infants and 
older. 592 9424.

7-9-3tp

REGISTERED Child Care
592-4312.

6 J8-8(p

£  HELP WANTED
HELP WANTED Kings 
Kids, mature, experienced, 
child care attendant. Part 
time, references required. 
Call Norma. 592 4242.

7 16 Up

MATURE LADY to work in 
Sales and Re stocking. Must 
bo amiable, well organized, 
and able to work in several 
different departments. 8 day 
week and about 5 hours day. 
$3.35 hour. Good conditions. 
Send letter of application to: 
land W „ Box 551, Iowa 
Park. Tex.

7 16 2tc

SERVICE ATTENDANT
with experience in auto & 
truck tire repair. Salary plus 
commission. 5 't  days per 
wk. Apply Johnson Rd. 
Fin*.

7 16 ltc

^  BUSINESS
>VE PAY top dollar for old 
and late model salvage 
Phone 592 9425 or 592 9045.

7-ltMtp

BUILDING, remodeling or 
repair, additions, carports, 
patios. Free estimates. Call 
day or night. Hilly McDonald 
592-4338. Phil McDonald 
592 2363.

6 11 8tc

PHOTOGRAPHY by Chris. 
Weddings, family reunions, 
home portraiture, senior 
pictures, team pictures. 
438 2367.

7 9 28tp

ROOFING Wolfe Roofing 
Co. Phone 592 5630.

1-1 tfc

JERRY’S VINYL REPAIR,
recoloring, auto, furniture, 
commercial. Free estimates,
438 2243.

2 23 tfc

NEED FILL SAND? Call
Donald Hallum, 592 4365. 
804 N. Wull, Iowa Park.

1 3 tfc

FASHION TWO TWENTY
Cosmetics. Annetta Reusch, 
consultant. #42 Surrey, 
592 9001.

7-3-tfc

MARY KAY COSMETICS
Allie Girard, consultant, 109 
W. Poe. 592 4217.

4 5 tfc

HOUSE PAINTING, inter 
ior, exterior. Steve Ming 
592 5122.

521 lOtp

PRIVATE FENCE sales and 
installation. Charles Skel 
ton, phone 592 5190.

2 19-20tp

CONCRETE WORK Any
kind 592 9403 or 592 9555.

9 27 52tp

STORM WINDOWS - Ma
chine blown insulation. Roof 
turbines installed. Free 
estimates. Jack Kerr, 215 S. 
Wall. 592-9040.

731 tfc

REMODELING, ADD-ONS. 
New Construction, Paper 
Hanging. Storm Windows. 
References 592 9783,
592 2349.

3 26 12tp

REMODELING? Do you 
need another room added 
on? A garage? Walls 
removed or added? Free 
estimates. References. Jack 
Kerr, SIS S. Wall. SIMMS.

731 tfc

MORAN MONUMENT
Works, Vernon. Texas, Old 
Highway 287. near East 
View Cemetery. A good 
selection of granites, reme 
tery lettering, grass mark 
ers. vases of bronze and 
marble.

9-30 tfc

BLACK POWDER GINS 
and accessories, revolvers 
$50 and up. Powder $4.80 lb. 
Will order modern guns for 
10% over cost. Ye Ole Gun 
Shack. 413 W. Washington. 
592 5480.

>14 tfc

Heatinq
V

Hendermm Refrigeration

*M V f f K X IS lX 592-4793
CW> XXX

FOR SALE 
NEW 3 BEDROOM

O l

IV  WOm. Am Me gwrwc* 1115 «q- ft 
ft. to «*” •«* M fk  f t o x U L W  

S c M  U i  tMTWe VKS-5B11

KINGS KIDS Christian Day 
Care Center “Iowa Park's 
Finest For Parents Who 
Care." Open 7 a.m. to 6 p.m. 

Mon. thru Fri. Openings for 
ages 2 yrs. & older. Summer 
activities include skating, 
swimming, putt putt, 
movies, 592 4242.

6 26 4tp

FOR TV REPAIRS, call 
Walt's TV, 592 2415.

6-18 15tp

p  NOTICE
WILL THE ONE who 
borrowed my lawn mower, 
please return it to Jimmy 
Henson? 592 5012.

7 16 ltp

FOUND Bicycle. Call and 
identify, 592 4285.

7-16-nc

LOST Black male cat. 
Owner will pay reward. Call
592 5094.

7-16 ltp

WANTED TO RENT Horse 
pasture. Phone 592-5418 
after 5 p.m.

7-16 ltp

PUBLIC NOTICE
The City of Holliday is 
accepting applications for 
employment with the city. 
Experience in water/waste 
water and other phases of 
city utilities preferred, but 
not a must. Wages commen­
surate with experience. For 
application contact City Hall 
of Holliday, phone
817 586 1313, P.O. Box 508, 
Holliday, Texas, 76366.

7-93tc

King's Kids 
Christian

Day Care & Preschool

“Iowa Park’s Finest 
For Parents Who Care" 

Ages 2 Yr« & Older 
Monday thru Friday 

7 a.m. to 6 p.m.

202 N. Jackson 592-1242

'JJuuVa£u£)jaaowtH $»OM$f

TOOL VALUE
OF THE MONTH

Q uantities lim ite d

G R I P - I T  / /
New
Concept 
in Tools

6-IN. STRAP 
WRENCH
The Grip-lt strap wrench 
handles any shape—with 
a soft touch' Works on 
fitters, plastic pipe etc. 
without damaging slip­
p in g  S6H

-

Parkway

va  c y  g* -\ h -ca  
o n  >isx.« s e e *

M ' M W .

IOWA PARK LODGE No. 7 13 A.F. & A.M.
700 W. Washington 592-5506
Stated Meeting 7:30 P.M. 2nd Thursday 

W.M. • Ronald Robinson ...592-2101 
Sec. - Bud Mercer. . . 592-5413

PLANT SALE
* CALADIUMS, 6” Pot $1.00 Ea.
* MISCELLANEOUS BEDDING PLANTS $1.06 I)oz
* HANGING BASKETS 30% Discount
* SHEEP and COW MANURE $3.00 Bag
* BARK MULCH $4.00 Bag
* FALL TOMATO PLANTS 6 for $1.25

Closed Sunday
________i_____

1 mile South on FM 1814 (Bell Rd.)

Gary’s Backhoe and Dozer Service

Gary W. Loyd
Phone 817 438 2958 

Day or Night

Box 110 
Kamay, Texas 

76369

Iowa Park 
Plumbing

Commercial - Residential
Remodel - Repair - Sewer Machines 

Mitch Miller

592-4019
Backhoe & Dump Truck 5 S

G a ry  C raw fo rd  B ackhoe Serv ice
592-4382

Gary Crawford 
Owner-Operator 
810 N. Yosemite 
Iowa Park, Tex. 76367

Oil Field
Commercial
Residertial

FINANCING B  m  A  FOOD STAMPS
VAILASIE -  l l| l  M ACCEPTf O

H i i _____L— J  Store - 592-2051L4L------- > J Store - 59Z-ZQ51
113 W.Cull N i g h t -592-4697

HIND
Quarter *1SL

7 2
Cut *
Wrapp'd ▼ 
Frozaci

U.S.D.A. Chote*

BEEF
Haavy

Qraln Fed Cut, Wrapped. Frozen
Pork Freezer Pack 

• Csntar Cut C»we*1 ft* Nrt t«M*

PACK #1
10 lb. CHUCK ROAST 
10 lb. CHOPPED SIRLOIN 
10 lb. SEVEN STEAK 
10 lb. PORK CHOPS 
10 lb. GROUND BEEF 
50 fb. $79.95

PACK f  3
10 lb. PORK STEAK 
10 lb. CHUCK ROAST 
10 lb. SPARE RIBS
10 lb. GROUND BEEF
10 lb. FRYERS
50 lb. $66.95

PACK$5
10 lb. PORK STEAK
10 lb. BACON
10 lb. GROUND BEEF
10 lb PORK ROAST
10 lb. FRYERS
50 to. $65.95

PACK 17
BEEF RIBS 
PORK CHOPS 
GROUND BEEF 
FRYERS

$S7J6

PACK # 2
10 lb. CHUCK ROAST 
10 lb. PORK STEAK 
10 lb. SEVEN STEAK 
10 lb. GROUND BEEF 
10 lb. FRYERS 
501b. $68.50

PACK » 4
10 lb. SEVEN STEAK 
10 lb. PORK STEAK 
10 lb. GROUND BEEF 
10 lb. PORK ROAST 
10 lb FRYERS 
50 H, $68.50

PACK•6
15 lb ROAST 
15 lb STEAK 
10 lb. CHOPPED SIRLOIN 
10 lb. GROUND BEEF 
50to *85.65

PACK$8
10 !b PORK CHOPS 
10 lb. PORK STEAK 
10 lb PORK SAUSAGE 
10 lb. PORK SPARE RIB 
10 !b FRYERS

4 U

We service all makes of washers, dryers, freezers, 
refrigerators and window air conditioners.

POSEY'S APPLIANCE SERVICE
Ph, 592-5432 Iowa Park208 James
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SHOP OUR

FOOD SALE

FRYERS
U.S.D.A. Whole

Thursday, Friday, Saturday ONLY

49
SILVER SPUR SLICED

BACON
C U T U P  lb. 59c Lb.

$|09

FAMILY PACK

PORK CHOPS ̂  *1"
HEAVY BEEF BONELESS

CHUCK STEAK u,
FRESH

GROUND CHUCK Lb.

$168

$168

SHURFRESH SLICED 12 oz.
LUNCH MEAT Pkg.

19 OSCAR MAYER SLICED 8o2 - _  
LUNCH MEAT Pkg. 1

VIENNA SAUSAGE 2 89*
RANCH STYLE

BEANS 3 c‘.: * 1

(Tide D etergent
V  * * 58

:

1 ,
,imit One with $10 Purchase!

BORDEN'S ASSORTED H A V O R S

■ c  $169
Ctn IICE CREAM

Good Thursday, Friday Saturday Onlyf

SHURFINEC.S.orW.K. ^  17oz 
CORN

GREEN GIANT FROZEN 
COB CORN
AURORA
TOILET TISSUE

6 Ear 
Pkg.

4  Roll

PRINGLE 8-9 OZ,
POTATO CHIPS Pkgs.
SHURFINE 32 oz
SALAD DRESSING Jar
RAINBO PROCESSED 32 oz. 
DILL PICKLES Jar

3  Cans

99*

Pkg. 99*
$ |1 9

99*
$ |  19

BAMA ASSORTED
FRUIT DRINKS
LIBBY
POTTED MEAT

KRAFT MACARONI O 2 .2 5 o z .^ ** , 
& CHEESE DINNERS ^  Pkgs. O V

4  B tfs*' *  1

3 Cans 89

CHIFFON SOFT STICK 
M ARGARINE Lb. Pkg. 59

Congratulations

SUPER0
JACKPOT

WINNER

Faye Matthews
recipient of

$480
Be Sure YOU Reslgter

*2,220This
Week

DRAWING ON CHANNEL 6 —  10 PJW  NEWS 
EVERY FRIDAY NIGHT

BRAWNY Jumbo
PAPER TOWELS Roll 69'

DEL MONTE — MIX or MATCH —
SPINACH, FRENCH STYLE BEANS 

SAUERKRAUT, CUT GREEN BEANS 2 16o z .
Cans /

COKE. SPRITE 
or MR. PIBB

6 $177
One-Liter

Bottle Plus Deposit

>  “ SPARKLING FRESH”  FRUITS AND VEGETABLES <

YELLOW

ONIONS
LARGE

VINE RIPENED TOMATOES Lb.

GEO RGIA

PEACHES


