
ective
105 MHS Seniors 
Receive Diplomas

The excitement of grad­
uation was plain on the fa­
ces of 105 young men and 
women Friday night as 
they marched in the pro­
cessional to the strains of 
the traditional “ Pomp and 
Circumstance.” A visual 
flashback con1'* be seen on 
many of the ung faces as

The driver’s license of­
fice will be closed for six 
weeks except for Mondays 
and Thursdays from 9 a.m. 
until 4 p.m. when C. D. 
Fitzgerald is in Muleshoe. 

***
The 198? Summer Pops 

featuring Helen Reddy will 
be performing at the Lub­
bock Memorial Civic Center 
on Friday, June 11, at 8:30 
p.m.

Founding conductor will 
be WMliam A Harrod. For 
further information you 
may contact Lubbock Sym­
phony Orchestta office 1721
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they left one world and en­
tered into another, giving 
more significance to the 
event than just a gradua­
tion from school.

The 1982 Senior Class of 
Muleshoe was led in by es­
corts Kelly Bayless and Mi­
chael Isaac attired in school 
colors of black and w! ite 
and using the class flower 
of a yellow rose to carry.

Commencement speaker 
Rev. J . E. Meeks touched 
on the future in his address 
to the gathering. His main 
topic was "Knocking At 
Closed Doors.” With the 
idea behind the title being 
to urge the young people 
present to continue knock­
ing at those doors through­
out their lives. “ A contin­
uous knocking will result in 
the doors being finally op­
ened,”  he said.

Meeks staged that among 
the Class of 1982 were 
some of the finest minds, 
and gifted lives anywhere if 
they were properly used. 
He pc ed out several gift­
ed people who had contin­
ued their quests, in spite of 
adversities, such as Wil­
liam Booth, Thomas Edison
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U. S. Department of Ag­
riculture loan rates have 
been established and are 
now applicable to 1982 Bai­
ley County crops. The reg­
ular loan on wheat is $3.54 
a bushel, reserve loan rate 
on wheat is $3.99 a bushel.

On corn, the regular loan 
rate is $2.69 a bushel, and 
reserve rate is $3.04 a bu­
shel. Grain sorghum will go 
into the regular loan at a 
rate of $4.36 per hundred 
weight and $4.95 per hun­
dred weight will apply to

Ten Local Students 
On SPC Honor Lists

ALMOST OV£7?-With the graduation exercises coming to a close, so is high school days 
for the graduating seniors at Muleshoe High School. Ore hundred and five students ed to the President’s 
received their diplomas Friday evening, May 21. include Karen Black

Oil, Gas Leases Exceed 
39,000 In County Acreage

Lazhuddie Junior High 
Band Wins Sweepstakes

With only eighteen mem­
bers on stage, the Lazbud- 
die Junior high band earn­
ed the school’s first sweep­
stakes Saturday, May 15, 
at the Floydada Junior 
High school band festival.

The band won first divi­
sions from the two concert 
judges and a first division 
from the sightreading judge 
to gain this honor. It is the 
first time a Lazbuddic band 
had ever won such an hon- 
or.

In addition to the sweep- 
stakes award, several stu­
dents also won first and

second division medals c, 
solo and ensemble pieces.

Earning a first division 
on ensembles were the 
flute trio of Traci Elliott, 
Cathy Schacher, and Jones- 
sa Jennings; the clarinet 
quartet of Kristine Miller, 
Shonda Mitchell, Cami Ivy, 
and Monica Locke; and the 
sax duet of Pat McBroom 
and Clint Russell.

Soloists earning a first 
division were Traci Elliott 
and Cathy Schacher, flutes; 
Kristine Miller, clarinet;
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Twelve Area Students 
Graduate South Plains

Oil lease activities are 
dtfhtttety keeping art up
ward pace in Bailey County 
with the filing of over 1200 
acres of lease properties 
this week. Since April 18, 
an additional 8,354 acres of 
oil and gas leases have 
been filed in Bailey Coun­
ty, bringing *hc total acre­
age in the r rst four and 
one-half months to 39,355 
acres.

In reviewing the leases 
filed since April 18, a 
heavy concentration of leas­
es have been filed in both 
the Bula and Enochs areas 
and north and south of

Gunter Awarded 
TAMU First

students from 
and the sur-

Twelve 
Muleshoe 
rounding area were a- 
mong 523 South Plains 
College graduates receiv­
ing diplomas and certifi­
cates during SPC’s 24th 
Graduation Ceremonies on 
May 7 in Texan Dome.

Muleshoe students re­
ceiving associate of ap­
plied science degrees in­

cluded Kent Rempc, radio 
and television servic...g; 
and Lyndal Stovall, diesel 
mechanics.

Students receiving certi­
ficates included Betty 
Claybrock, vocational nur­
sing; Minerva Martinez, 
vocational nursing; Linette 
Newman, vocational nurs-
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Brent Gunter of Mule­
shoe has received the new­
ly created Richard ‘Buck’ 
Weirus “ Spirit Award” at 
Texas A&M University.

The award, named in 
honor of the director emer­
itus of the Association of 
Former Students, was pre­
sented to 52 students who 
hade outstanding contribu­

tions to student life.
Gunter, a senior animal 

science major, is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Gunter. 
He was presented a framed 
certificate and a distinctive 
wa*ch during a special 
awards ceremony.

those communities. There 
is also a fairly heaCy
centration of lease activity 
in the Baileyboro area, 
both north and south of the 
town of Baileyboro.

Another large lease site 
is that near Goodland, Tex­
as and westward towaids 
the State Line.

Some of the leases filed' 
have been purchased by 
W. Wayne Gill and S. K. 
Fisk; however, Atlantic 
Richfield is also in on the 
buying activity.

A rundown of leases filed 
this week arc as follows:

D. J. Cox and w La- 
Vern Cox to W. Wayne Gill 
-Floyd County School Land 
League 182, Tract 1, Labor 
88: Tract 2, Labor 89: Tract 
3, Labor 91.

The American National 
Bank to W. Wayne Gill -  
All of Labors 3,4,5,6,/,8,14 
and 25, Lubbock County

ScIhioI Lands, League 1%.
uociia Coburn jo

W. Wayne Gill -  S/2 SE/4 
of Section 37, Block Z, 
State Capitol Lands, Lea-

Cont. Page 6, Col. 4

LEVELLAND - Ten stu­
dents from Muleshoe and 
other Bailey County towns 
have been named to the 
President’s and Dean’s Ho­
nor lists at South Plains 
College for the 1982 spring 
semester.

To qualify for placement 
on the President’s List, 
SPC students must main­
tain a 4.0 or “ straight A” 
grade point average for the 
semester. Students on the 
Dean's Honor List must 
maintain a minimum grade 
point average of 3.25. All 
honor students must enroll 
for a minimum of 12 se­
mester hours.

Muleshoe students nam- 
List 
and

Jimmy Watson. Named to 
the Dean's Honor List were 
Nancy Allison, 3.77; Davicd 
Lust, 3.35; Kevin Smith, 
3.50; and Charleson Stein- 
bock, 3.71.

Karol DeSautell of Bula, 
and Belinda Richardson of 
Maple both were named to 
the President’s List.

Renee Beasley of Enochs
was named to the honor 
list with a 3.81 GPA. Also 
named to the honor list 
were Mary Merkel of Laz-

buddie, 3.77; and Sandy 
Feagley of Maple, 3.50.

“ We wish to extend our 
congratulations to these
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Raider Day 
Scheduled 
May 27

The Annual Red Raider 
Day celebration will be 
held here in Muleshoe on 
Thursday, May 27, at the 
Muleshoe Country Club. 
This is a “ Stags Only” e- 
vent, sorry ladies.

The golf tournament will 
kick off with a sign-in at 
1:30 p.m. on May 27, with 
the shotgun start scheduled 
at 2 p.m. This is an open 
tournament.

Following the tournament 
will be a refreshment hour 
at 6 p.m. and a dinner 
beginning at 7 p.m.

Guests at this year's 
event will again include 
Texas Tech head football 
coach, Jerry Moore, along 
with other coaches and 
many out of town special

Cont. on Page 6, Col. 6

County Democrats Endorse 
Resolutions, Elect Officers

The Bailey County Demo­
cratic convention was held 
at 2:30 p.m. Saturday, May 
15 in the Bailey County 
courthouse. County Co- 
chairman, Charles L. Smith 
Jr. was elected to serve as 
permanent chairman and 
Nelda Merriott will serve 
as permanent secretary for 
the convention.

Delegates were elected 
along with two alternates to 
attend the state Democratic 
Convention which will je

held this year in Dallas on 
September 10 and 11. Dele­
gates elected were Charles 
Smith and Linda Guelker. 
Hugh Young and Gordon 
Green were elected as al­
ternates.

The convention consider­
ed and adopted several re­
solutions and they are list­
ed in the following order:

Dparents of school stu­
dents should be required to 
show proof of lack of in­

come before being eligible

May City Sales Tax Rebate 
Reflects 1.58%  Increase

AUSTIN, Tex. -  State 
Comptroller Bob Bullock 
Thursday sent checks total­
ing $96.5 million to %6 
Texas cities as their share 
of the one-percent city 
sales tax for May.

Local Private Club 
Permits Granted

•'SPIRIT OF V 7C 70*r’--Monty Hysinger, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Hy.inger was awarded the bronze victory 
medal Wednesday by Major Joe Collins with the United 
State Army Reserve. To meet the requirements a stu­
dent must letter in a high school sport and be among 

scholastically.

On March 12, 1982 three 
Bailey County residents fil­
ed with the Texas Alco­
holic Beverage Commission 
an application for a private 
club registration permit and 
a beverage cartage permit. 
John Curtis Slaughter Jr., 
Robert Lee Copeland, Jr., 
and James Orville Elder, 
applied for such license to 
be known as “ The Slaugh­
terhouse,” located 3/10 
mile west of the Muleshoe 
City limits on Highway 84.

A hearing was held on 
April 28 before the TABC 
with regard to this permit 
and protests filed against it 
at that time.

Following that hearing. 
On May 18, Hallic Huttash, 
Hearings Examiner for the

“ This fifth monthly re­
bate for this year brings 
the total these cities have 
receiveo to more than $318 
million,” Bullock said.

“ That's almost 13 per­
cent ahead of what theae 
cities had received this 
time last year.”

Houston received the 
biggest check, 20.3 million, 
which brings the total that 
city has received to $67.6 
million, up 16 percent over 
last year.

Muleshoe’s city sales tax 
check for the month of May 
1982 wa* $26,392.08, re­
flecting a downward trend 
against the $29,517.33 pay­
ment at the came time in 
1981. Payments in 1932 to 
date amount to $87,611.28 
however, a 1.58% increase 
from 1981 payments of 
$86,251.66 at the same 
time.

May sales rebates for the 
City of Morton amounted to 

conclusion that it had not $6,708.42, down from the

TABC issued a recommen­
dation following Ml consi­
deration of the applications 
and protests. Her recom­
mendation was that the ap­
plication in question Lc 
granted.

The examiner found that 
it had not been proven that 
the place or manner in 
wnich the tpplicant might 
conduc. its business war­
ranted the refusal of a per­
mit. Ms. Huttash's findings 
were also based on the

been proved that t! e ap­
plicant would sell liquor 
unlawfully in a dry area, or 
in a manner contraty to 
law, or would knowingly 
permit an agent, servant or 
employee to do so.

$7,014.20 of the same time 
this period last year. The 
1982 payments to date have 
reached $22,034.54, though 
up from $21,534.21 at the 
same time last year -  a 
2.32% change.

City sales tax rebates in 
Littlefield for the May per­
iod were $37,931.59; down 
from last year’s comparable 
payment of $44,847.33. To­
tal 1982 payments to date 
have reached $110,214.12, 
also down a -7.40% from 
last year’s payments of 
$119,023.04.

In Friona, the May sales 
tax rebate was $13,777.68, 
up over the comparable 
payment in 1981 of $15,- 
373.59. 1982 payments to 
date total $45,752.92, re­
flecting a 13.48% change 
from the $40,318.18 of 19- 
81.

In Farwell, city sales tax 
net payments for the month 
of May were $3,743.48; up 
slightly from the $3,542.15 
comparable payments in 
1981. Farwell’s 1982 pay­
ments to date reached $10,- 
270.68, up some 5.35% 
from comparable payments 
in 1981 of $9,748.65.'

• Dallas -zeeived $10 mil­
lion, for a 1982 total of 
$34.3 million, up nearly 8 
percent over 1981.

The cities of Fort Worth 
and Austin each received 
$3.2 million checks and El 
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for free meals for school 
students.

2) Aiiens should not be 
allowed to get food stamps.

3) Any members of the 
House of Representatives 
or Senate of the U. S. who 
were elected as Democrats, 
should be isolated from the 
Democratic party if they 
support President Reagan's 
budget cuts as they are 
now presented.

4) Before any entitlement 
programs are cut, foreign 
aid should be cut the same 
percentage.

5) When elevators go 
bankrupt with farmer own­
ed grain in their possession 
farmers should have first 
priority on the money or 
assets of such elevator.

6) Distribution of excess 
agricultural products should

Cont. on Page 6, Col. 6

the reserve loan. Barley 
will have a regular loan of 
$2.10 per bushel, but will 
be $2.39 per bushel in the 
reserve.

Storage on commodities 
will be paid at a rate of 
26.5 cents per bushel on all 
grains entering the reserve 
loan.

County ASCS Executive 
Director Rusty Williamson 
has issued a reminder to 
producers that June 1, 1982 
is the final date to enter 
their 1981 crops of com, 
cotton and grain sorghum 
into the loan. This is an 
important date for farmers 
to remember, and is just 
around the corner, said 
Williamson.

County producers who 
wish to have their summer 
seeded crops measured aer­
ially should be signed up 
on or. by July 1, 1982 to 
assure that they will re­
ceive that service.

Williamson also has is­
sued a reminder to produc­
ers that have not certified
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Pfc, Franklin 
Decorated

Pfc. Billy D. Franklin, 
son of Bill R. and Mary 
Franklin of 1915 W. Ave. 
H, Muleshoe, Texas, has 
been decorated with the 
Army Achievement Medal 
at Fort Riley, Kan.

The medal is awarded to 
soldiers for achievement or 
meritorious service and acts 
of courage.

Franklin is a forward ob-' 
server with the 1st Bat­
talion. 5th Field Artillery.

He is a 1979 graduate of 
Muleshoe High School.

Mary Mata 
Receives 82-83 
Scholarship

Mary E. Mata, a fresh­
man computer information 
systems major at West Te­
xas State University from 
Muleshoe, has been award­
ed a $200 scholarship for 
Tie 1982-83 academic year.

Mata received the schol­
arship from AMOCO dur­
ing the annual School of 
Business Awards Convoca­

tion  where representatives 
ci area business firms and 
members of the School of 
Business faculty presented 
almost $27,000 in scholar­
ships. Members of Alpha 
Kappa Psi, national profes­
sional business fraternity, 
hosted the awards cere­
mony.

Mata is a Don and Sybil 
Harrington Honor Scholar 
and has been listed on the 
dean's honor roll and the 
National Dean's list.

0 UTSTANDING--Kristi Henry, daughter of Mrs. Marcia 
Henry, was awarded the bronze “ Spirit of Victory” 
award Wednesday by Major Joe Collins of the U. S. 
Army Reserve in Lubbock. The award is based on 
athletic and scholastic accomplishments, and the medal­
lion is designed from the same ■ basic concept as the 
Olympic medals.



Sudan and Michael Bishop 
of Poitsboro.

One of the great gran 
mothers, Mrs. Katie Turner 
lives i;. Sudan. _______

Page 2, Bailey County Journal. Muleshoe, Texas, Sunday, May 23, 1982 Micfad Uureano Bishop
Spearman.

Great grandparents are 
Mts. John Birdwell of Lub­
bock and R. E. Bounds of 
Stanford.

LATEST
ARRIVALS

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Bish­
op of Pottsboro are the 
proud parents of a son, 
Michael Laureano, who was 
born at 3:50 a.m. May 2.

He weighed eight pounds 
and five ounces and was 21 
inches long. He has a sis­
ter, Brandi, three years of

A child may have too 
much of his mother’s 
blessing.

-John Ray.

Tom K. Bonds, D.D.S
121 W A ve. B.

General Dentistry
New Hours Include:

Saturday 9-12
Monday-Friday 8-5 
Wednesday 8-12

For Appointm ent Coll: 
972-3446 Or 272-351C

OhesleyEdward Phelps
Mr and Mrs. Matt 

Phelps are the proud par­
ents of a son, Chesley l£d- 
ward, born at 4:05 p. m . 
Monday, May 17, in the 
Methodist Hospital in Lub­
bock.

The young man weighed 
seven pounds and six oun­
ces and was 20'/i inches 
long. He is the couple's 
first child.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Bernard Phelps 
of Muleshoe and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Gressett of

IN STR U M EN T  For Informotion Coll

^ llJ U r  272-5105
"N o  Loon Too Large O r Too Sm all"

Muleshoe Pawn
, 213 S. 1st

PIANO RECITAL -Students of Elaine Damron held a piano recital recently. Pictured Back 
row (L-R) Selina Gonzales, Ali Cage, Lisa Hamilton, Marleea Cox, Kelly Hamblin, Ken 
Craft, Elaine Damron, teacher; front row: D’Anne Box, Stacy McElroy, Lashelle Scoggin, 
Amy Turner, Dayna Hamilton, Heather Hutton, Corley Hutton, and Jeremy Bruns.

the June 3 luncheon will be 
Lydia Wright and Pat Cum­
mins.

Silk roses and bud vases 
were presented to Kay Ma- 
dry and Betty Barker, in 
honor of their birthdays.

Those attending the 
meeting included Mildred 
Williams, Millie Mitchell, 
Marv Smith, Lydia Wright, 
Nora Flanary, Lois Martin­
et’, Kay Madry, Linda Cog- 
liandro. Shelly Pickering 
and Jerrod, Pat Cummins 
of Sudar, Glenda Duncan, 
Dell Aycock of Sudan, Ed­
na Haynes and Brenden, 
Karen Mason, Deanna Ras- 
co, Pam Thompson and 
Barbara Goodwin of Earth, 
and a visitor, Bertha Wel- 
kener of Sudan.

For additional informa­
tion on WOTS you may 
contact Mildred Williams at 
272-5260 or Lois Martinec 
at 272-3019.

WOTS
Weekly
Meeting

I S$SSS36X$Se3S3«XStX$3tXSe^
Marv Smith and Millie 

Mitchell were the hostesses 
for the May 20 WOTS meet 
which was held at Summit 
Savings and Loan commun­
ity room.

May 27 will be the “ Eat 
Out” day and the group 
has elected to eat at the 
Dairy Queen. Hostesses for

' Free Mounting
* Free Balancing
' No-Trade Required 
'  Full Road Hazard 
Guarantee
'  Optional Computer 
Balance Only 3.50 Ea
* Additional Mounting 
Charge on all Split 
Rims

Progressive 
Home Club

W herever you drive  w hatever the season -  no  m atter 
what the co n d it io n s  -  the new  C ordovan  P rem ier IV 
A IL  SEASONS rad ia l is the perfec t answ er to  your 
d riv ing  needs

No m atter where you live  w eather cen surprise  you — 
slippery dow n p o urs  o l ra in  o r, m uddy areas can sudden ly  
tu rn  d ry  roads »nlo very dange rous d riv in g  co n d itio n s

The Progressive Homes 
CLub met Wednesday, May 
19 in the home of Roxie 
Hoover. Seven members 
answered roll call.

Wenona Gibson, presi­
dent, conducted the busi­
ness meeting. A treasurer’s 
report was given by Vera 
Engelking, treasurer. Na- 
oma Black was in charge of 
the program.

Norene Thomas drew the 
hostess gift, and Wenona 
Gibson received a birthday 
gift from her secret pal.

Refreshments were serv-' 
ed to Wenona Gibson, Vera 
Engelking, Lucille Harper, 
Norene Thomas, Naoma 
Black, Mozelle Rippie and 
the hostess. Roxie Hoover.

T h t C o rdovan  P rem ier IV A LL SEASONS R edia l g ive * 
you freedom ' No need to  w o rry  abo u t unexpected  w eather 
changes or road c o n d it io n *  Go where you  w ant to g o  — 
at any tim e w ith  com ple te  co n fid e n ce  in  tire  perform ance

Stock No. 45C 3, P175-80R13 
REG. 54.85 SALE.................

C o u t l i n i n g  
S y s te m ic  

I n s e c t i c i d e
Stock No. 46C66, P235-75R14 
REG. 72.13 - S A LE ..........
Stock No. 45C34, P205-75R15 
R E G . 68.18 - SALE ................
Stock No. 45C45, P215-75R15 
REG. 75.58 - S A LE .................

Stock No. 45C38, P185-75R14 
REG. 61.51 S A L E ...............SYSTEMIC

ACTION
Kill

aphids & 
fertilize

IT’ S EASY

Stock No. 45C39, P195-75R14 
REG. 62.44 - SALE <...............

Stock No. 45C47, P205-75R14 
REG. 65.40 S A LE ................
Stock No. 45C60, P215-75R15 
REG. 70.12 - SA LE.................

Stock No. 45C49, P225-75R15 
REG. 74.89 - S A LE .................

Boiley County Journal Stock No. 45C64, P235-75R15 
REG . 80.16 - SA LE.................

Stock NO 17CU 

A lt  13 R ev I t  1? Sale
Stock NO S7E47

F 7 t  u .  R e g . 47.20 s a le
L. B H»M President 

James Woods-Vice President 
Shtrkry Farmer News 

Evetene H am s Society 
H o llv  M i»s *p  Advertising 
Sammye Hall-Bookkeeper

S tock NO 17C14 
B 7 I 13. Reg I f  43 S a le

S leek N o S7C-60 
G 7» .!4 , Reg 48-41 S a leBaker Farm 

Supply
l.t>32 W . Am er. 

Blvd. 
272-4613

tT O C K  NO 1 7 0 5  
C 7 8 IJ , R ag  41 43 S a l*

Muleshoe Journol and Boiley County Journal 
today and surroundmg counties *12" 
Muleshoe Journol and Boiley County Journo*

S tock N o. 1 7 0 8  
C 7 I U . Rag 41.88 S ale

Slock N o 47E45 

G78 IS. R eg 50 6 ^ Sale

.85” WHITEWALL ALL 17C SERIES STOCK NUMBERS 
ARE 2 PLY - 4 PLY RATED CONSTRUCTION The 4 ply, 
polyester cord body resists impact, blow outs, 
deterioration. You get a softer, quieter ride with no road 
whine or joint slap and no morning thump.

S lock  N o  I7C38 
078  14. R eg  4 } 4 4 S ale

Advertising rote cord on opplKaron S T O C K  N O . 57E49 
M78-1S, Reg 53.28 S a l t

S lock  NO I7C40 
E78 14. R eg  4 } M  S ale s to c k  N o  57ES4

L78 15. R eq  SI 42 Sal,..

Summit Savings
Association

Introduces

“NoCost Checking”
Summit Pays You

514% Compounded Daily 
And Your First Check Order 

Is FREE
You Pay

No Service Charge 
And

No Minimum Balance 
Is Required

Open Your Account Today!
We Invite You To

A ,  ",JOIN US AT THE TOP"

{Jjj Summit Savings Association
. OFFICES IN

P L A I N V I f - W ,  F L O V D A D A .  M A T A D O R  H A U ^ T E R ^ L E S M O I  
L I T T L E F I E L D  F R l O f l A  F A R  W E L L  P L A N O  a n d  A L L E N

IG LC
BtLkryft

S*YES GASOLltf
L ®  1  U S  Q U A ffl l

Q u a k e r  S ta te H a v o lin e
10W40

P en n zo il
10W 40

IG -L O  B ra n d

12.02

SPECIAL
QUART SPECIAL

QUART
SPECIAL
Q u a r t

SaaA? e’ D Portales 
2600 S. M abry Drive - Clov 

1302 W. American B l v d . - S

F A R M  &  R A N C H  S U P P L Y

T A
MEMBER 1982

TEXAS PRES S  ASSOCIATION



HARDWARE STORES

Your local independently owned True Value Hardware Store has national chain-buying power.

t m i

BOl Sf, n t f

WHITE LATEX 
HOUSE PAINT

WOOD
SCRAPERSPECIAL Cartridge 

LATEX CAULK
Seal cracks around windows, 
doors, siding, dries fast. 
Adheres securely. Water 
cleanup. White. (86)

2-PC. BRUSH SET Ideal for home, farm and 
factory; masonry, wood and 
metal. Easy to apply. Dries 
fast. Water clean up. L-24

The "Painting Pals" will make do-it-yourself painting jobs 
easier. Set includes special 4" wall brush and 1V4” nylon 
angular sash brush. P415-TV-09

Double-sided steel blade 
for quick removal & paint, 
varnish 7 " handle. 3050PR

C A M P B E L L  $ H A U S F E L D

GLASS
CLEANER

STEP LADDER 0 * 3 4 "
SPRAY GUN 
AND REGULATOR
Spray gun and regulator with 
'/* "  fittings. Use with 1/3 to 1 
h.p compressors. SK-2001

GLASS ~  
CLEANER
Cuts grease without streak­
ing. Keeps and shines win­
dows, mirrors, chrome, 
porcelain, marb a, etc. An 
economical refill for nlunger 
spray bottles. (GC9)

Knee-braced top and bottom 
steps for steadier support 
Heat-treated aluminum con­
struction with spill-proo? 
shelf. 365
• Ft. Ladder. 366 ...... 00 00

MARVELUSTRE® 
Latex Semi-Gloss
Our best enamel dries to a 
smooth, scrubbable finish. 
44 colors & white. E

Now, 3 Finishes! 
Flat Satin 
Gloss

h a tex  flat
*Wl I HIM H*91SPACKLING

COMPOUND
Cleans, brightens, freshens 
all types of carpet, rugs, 
upholstery. Resists resoiling. 
Concentrated: Gallon diluted 
with water does 2,000 sq. 
ft RS-18

Ready mixed for easy inte­
rior patching of plaster, dry- 
wall and wood Dries rast, 
sands smooth.

I  Gallon
E-Z KARE® 
LATEX FIAT 
WALL RNISH
The ecrubbeble interior latex 
with a low-sheen flat finish 
that actually resists toiling. 
For walls & woodwork in 
every room. . EZ

Our finest tcrylic latex exterior house psir.t now available 
In three finishesl For long-lasting protection from extreme 
temperature changes plus fade-resistant pigments. 
Whichever finish, WeatherAII* stays beautiful longer—  
without frequent touch-ups I HPX/SHP/GHP
A) Hat. 25 Town §  Country colors, white & black.
B) Satin. White, black & custom colors.
Gloee. Not shown. White, black, custom colors 1 I.M  Gal.* 
*Cnten Caters Higher

2-PACK
ROLLER $ 9 2 2  
COVERS *
Two 9" covers with deep ab­
sorbent pile for use with inte­
rior latex paints.

Fry & Cox Inc

‘ wards were Presented a‘ the Elaine Damron recital

S ™ ? h S s f t  E J f w E £ r L f o r t '? '
and Heather Hutton. Highest Whhlock theory’. ' h'gheSt pnmary theory;

TOPS
Weekly Meeting

Mulechoc TOPS Chapter 
TX. #34 met at 6:30 p.m. 
Thursday, May 20, in the 
meeting room of Bailey 
County Electric.

Edna Haynes, president, 
called the meeting to order 
and Retha Knowles said 
the opening prayer. The 
TOPS and KOPS pledges 
were recited and the fel­
lowship song sung.

Teavell Parker, weight 
recorder, called the roll

with 30 members present. 
Minutes of the previous 
meeting were read and ap­
proved.

Named weekly best loser 
was Mary Garcia. The first 
runner up was Neomi Gar­
za, second runner up was a 
tie between Aurora Mata 
and Edna Haynes.

Evelyn Moore received 
material for three consecu­
tive weeks weight loss.

Linda Vinson celebrated 
her birthday and received a 
gift from the birthday box.

The program for the eve­
ning was the singing of 
TOPS songs. The meeting 
was dismissed with singing 
the goodnight song.

Rlce-Sauuge Cx»*erole

1 lb. country sausage 
meat

'/j onion, minced 
1 11-oz. can condensed 

tomato soup 
IV* c water

3 c cooked rice
Vt c grated cheese

Brown sausage meat and 
onion. Drain off excess fat. 
Thoroughly mix together the 
tomato soup, water and rice. 
Arrange alternate layers of 
meat and rice in a greased 
2-quart casserole. Sprinkle 
cheese over the top. Bake for 
30 minutes in a 350 degree 
oven.

Look to the G 
for leading 
over-all 
performance.
Year a fter year, grow ers com e  
back to Funk's U -5 2 2 D R .

W hy? Because it perfo»m s con­
sistently. T h ro u g h  good years and  
bad, disease pressure or drouth.

A nd  now, G -5 2 2 D R  is availab le  
as H E R B IS H IE L D  seed, so you  
can use B IC E P  or M IL O C E P "  
herbicide fo r tough , h igh ly  e ffec­
tive control of both weeds and  
grasses.

All across the sorghum  belt, 
G -5 2 2 D R  yields are  im pressive, 
topping m a jo r com petito rs  tim e  
ana again.

G -5 2 2 D R  is resistant to  dow ny  
mildew. Head sm ut, too. A nd  has 
resistance to S train  A  of M aize  
D w arf M osaic  V irus (M D M V -A ) ,  
and to lerance to  northern  leaf 
blight. It ’s trop ica lly  adap ted  for 
extra w eatherability . D evelops  
sturdy stalks. S tands un iform .
A nd produces h ig h -q ja lily  go ld en- 
bronze grain .

Its w ide adap ta tion  and m ed ium  
m aturity  m a k e  G -5 2 2 D R  easy to  
m anage, a .vise add ition  to m ost 
sorghum  program s. Plant G -5 2 2 D P  
th L  year. Chances are, y o u ’ll 
com e back.

G -5 2 2 D R , H E R B 'S H IE L D  or 
regular. Setting a new pace in 
sorghum .

r r r e r UMfc’ s IV A  brand in iiw t limb*' s identity vAfieties
The limitation of warranty im l remedy 
on the t4d attached to ear h bag of 
Funk •, G Hybrids sold ■% a par. / the 
terms of vale thereof

B ic e p  a n d M i l t x e p  a re  
re g itt tre e f tra d e m a rk s  o f
C . IB A -C 5  IG Y  C o r p o r a t io n

V.fe really w ant to be p^rt 
of your sorghum program .

Wiedebush & Co.
1620 W . Am er. B lvd.

272-4281

The Muleshoe Singing 
group met in the fellowship 
hall of the Trinity Baptist 
Church Saturday, May 15 
at 7:30 p.m.

J. C. Shanks was in 
charge and J. M. Crawford 
gave the invocation. There 
were 23 present including 
Arch Gibson and Birdie 
McAdoo of Lubbock, two 
from Olton and one from 
Farwell.

Gibson brought new 
books for those who wanted 
the latest books. Gibson 
and Mrs. McAdoo led the 
singing, some was out of 
the new book

‘‘Cecil Rundell gave two 
numbers on the harmonica 
with Mrs. J. C. Shanks at 
the piano,” says Clara Cof­
fman. “ Everyone enjoyed 
the different arrangements, 
and the different music."

Officers for the coming 
year were elected. Those 
elected were Cecil Rundell, 
president; Mrs. Eva Ash­
ford, secretary and treasur­
er and Clara Coffman, re­
porter.

Summer clothes are made 
of featherweight fabrics to 
give a light and airy look. 
Garments are made of linen, 
silk, cotton, and cotton 
blends.

None are so busy as the It is easy t0 condemn with 
fool and knave. a laugh.

•John Dryden. -J

As busy as bees.
-Geoffrey Chaucer.

Muleshoe 
Singing Group
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J a venal.

If you are wise, laugh.
-Martial.

• I Don’t Waste Energy • I’m Virtually Trouble-Free • I'm Easy to Adapt •  I Can 
Save You Money • I’m Clean, I Won’t Dirty Your Walls or Curtains •  I’m Very 
Efficient • I’m E l e c t r i c _____________ ____ ________________

M ost heating units are ineffic ient because they have to create  
heat. I’m one that doesn’t . . .  I’m the Heat Pump.

I move heat already in the area from one place to the other. In the  
w inter I actually gather heat from outdoors to warm your home. In 
the sum m er I reverse myself and becom e an air conditioner.

For more inform ation, contact your Southw estern Public Service 
Com pany m anager, today!

SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY
909.3

01268723
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,/fW £ DATE SET -Peggy Marie Cippele and David N. 
Dillman announce their engagement and approaching 
marriage, June 12, in the First United Methodist Church 
of Sherman with the Rev. Jack Gibson, minister, officiat­
ing. Parents of the couple are Mr. and Mrs. W. H. 
Moore of Pottsboro and Mr. and Mrs. Neal Dillman of 
Muleshoe. The bride elect is a graduate of Pottsboro 
High School, Grayson County College and Southeastern 
Oklahoma State University in Durant. Dillman is a 
graduate of Muleshoe High School, McMurry College 
and Abilene Christian University. The couple will make 
their home in Sherman where she is employed by 
Southmayd-Sadler Consolidated Independent School Dis­
trict and Dillman is Associate Admissions Director of 
Austin College.

Summer Classes
Start

June 9 U
Register Now-Classes Limited
Tumbling 
Trampoline 
Dance 
Gymnastics

Boys & Girls 
Ages 3 & Up

Call: 272-4017, 272-3483 Or 965-2353 
Hawkins & Purdy School O f Dance

Miss Leslie Wagnon, 
bride elect of Scott Denney, 
was honored with a pre­
nuptial shower Sunday, 
May 16 from 2:30-4 p.in. in 
the home of Mrs. Ben 
Green.

Guest* were greeted by 
Mrs. Joe Mack Wagnon, 
the honoree and Mrs. Joe

Harrison1s 
Host End 
Of Year Party

The Progress 4-H Club 
hosted an end of the year 
party for Bailey County 4-H 
Clubs Tuesday, May 11, in 
the home of Donald and 
Bobbie Harrison.

A short business meeting 
was held and Assistant 
County Agent Jimmie Irwin 
discussed the 4-H Clubs’ 
Iowa exchange students 
that will be staying with 
families in Baiiey County in 
June.

Fifteen 4-H’ers from Io­
wa will be staying in var­
ious homes. Numerous acti­
vities are being planned for 
a fun packed week.

Hot dogs, chili, chips, 
cake and homemade ice 
cream were served to those 
in attendance from Three 
Way, Muleshoe, Y-L and 
the Progress Clubs.

Those attending included 
Shelley Sain, Sharia Morri­
son, Edie and Cooper Black 
Kristen and Doug Chitwood 
Polly, Amy and Brandi 
Harrison, Kristi Campbell, 
Sherri and Todd Bessire, 
Michael Dunham, Jerry 
Boh Graves, Kevin and 
Greg Atwood, A. J. Liles, 
Jodie, Jamie, Wade and 
Belinda Wheeler and Mitzi 
Robertson.

Also Michelle Lane, Rus­
sell Brown, Chris Hopkins, 
Barry Bass, Brett Pylant, 
Jay Gleascn, Dee Kinard. 
Kim Farmer, Crystal Cox, 
Alan Harrison, Jim, Bar­
bara and Sarah Irwin, Wal­
ter and Rose Sain, Herman 
and Joyce Morrison, Jack 
and Bobbie Durham, Jerry 
Harrison, Dick and Sandy 
Chitwood, Travis and Sue 
Bessire, Alice Liles, Betty 
Cox, Ted and Bettie Har­
rison, Jerry and Margaret 
Gleason, Joe and Letha 
Wheeler, Mac Brown and 
Donald and Bobbie Harri­
son.

i v r y
OF THE WEEK

MAGESTIC TOWEL

bath

Pure Luxury. 
Now on Sale

Reg. 4 .99 . Dundee’s® “M a­
jestic” towel is softly elegant 
100% cotton terry in beige, 
bittersweet, pink, navy, or 
brown. Extra-absorbent and 
extra-large it measures 24” 
X 4 8 ” . Hand towel, reg. 3.49 
- now 2 for $5. Wash cloth, 
reg. 1.S9 - now 2 for $3.

Epsilon Delta Holds 
Last Meeting O f Year

Denney, and registered by 
Jody Beth Field, niece of 
the bride elect.

Charlotte Field served 
apricot slush, assorted 
cookies and nuts from 
brass and crystal appoint­
ments.

The serving table was 
covered with ecru lac; over 
ecru satin cloth, and en­
hanced with an arrange­
ment of peach and earth 
tone flowers. The lionorce’s 
corsage was made of apri­
cot silk flowers.

Special guests included 
the bride elect’s mother, 
Mrs. Joe Mack Wagnon; 
Mrs. Joe Denney, mother 
of the prospective groom; 
Mrs. 0 . D. Ray. great aunt 
of the bride elect; Mrs. W. 
B. Wagnon Jr., aunt of the 
bride elect; and Miss Me­
lissa Wagnon, cousin of the 
bride elect.

The hostess gift was a 
Hoover Vacuum cleaner.

Hostesses for the occa­
sion included Mrs. Ross 
Goodwin, Mrs. Gordon Wil­
son, Mrs. Douglas Bales, 
Mrs. Butch Vandiver, Mrs. 
Curtis Smith, Mrs. James 
Brown, Mrs. Haroid Cow­
an, Mrs. Tom Flowers, 
Mrs. Gary Dale, Mrs. D.
0 . Burelsmith, Mrs. Haney 
Poynor, Mrs. Kirby Brant-' 
ley and Mrs. Ben Green.

Also, Mrs. Roycc Turner, 
Mrs. Bill Harmon, Mrs. 
Johnny Furgeson, Mrs. 
Randy Marlow, Mrs. Dur- 
wood Jones, Mrs. LaDema 
Wright, Mrs. Luther Hall, 
Mrs. Pete Wilkenson, Mrs. 
Robert Blackwood, Mrs. 
Rope Bell, Mrs. John Neil 
Agee and Mrs. Merlyn 
Neel. ______________

SMILES
Too Much Fuss

Widow, writing to an in­
surance company: ‘‘You 
have asked me to fill out so 
many proofs of claims ar d 1 
have had so much trouble in 
getting my money that I 
sometimes wish my husband 
hadn’t died.”

At Last The Tnilh
“Are you listening to the 

news, dear?”
“No, I heard the news.

I’m listening to the meaning 
of the news.”

"What does he say?"
“ He says he doesn't 

know what it means.

% m m .I K  -' ■

■ ■  u  lit 
a  7 . -(T  t-%*T s X . .

MISS LESLIE WAGNON

Epsilon Delta chapter of 
IfSA met Tuesday, May H 
in the home of Magann 
Rcnnels for their last meet­
ing of the year. Sharon 
Mongtomery was the co­
hostess.

Mrs. Montgomery, presi­
dent, called the meeting to 
order and read the opening 
ritual.

Officers were installed 
for the coming year. Those 
installed were president, 
Sharon Montgomery, re-el­
ected: Lisa McElroy, vice 
president; Debbie Kittrell, 
secretary; Pat Young, trea­
surer; Diana Harrison, edu­
cational director and Lou- 
venia Garlington, chaplain. 
These officers were install­
ed by Mrs. Montgomery.

The fall rush was discus­
sed and named were sub­
mitted and voted on. Jon­
quil Girl announced the 
brithdays and anniversaries 
for May.

Committee reports were 
given. It was decided to

have a special story hour 
on May 19 at the Muleshoe 
Public Library. Each mem­
ber performed a talent for 
the special “ Talent Show” 
for those attending.

Outgoing president, Sha­
ron Montgomery, received 
a gift for outstanding 
job she did as president 
this year.

The Jewel Pin ceremony 
was conducted by Mrs. 
Montgomery. Pledges Judy 
Watson and Denise Bland 
received their Jewel Pins.

Secret sisters were re­
vealed and gifts were ex­
changed. Names were also 
drawn for new secret sis­
ters.

ice cream parfaits and 
cookies were served by the 
hostesses to Elaine Bur­
gess, Jan Crawford, Lou- 
venia Garlington, Diana 
Harrison, Denise Bland, 
Debbie Kittrell, Judy Lam­
bert, Rita Lane, Lisa Mc­
Elroy, Sylvia Vourzeris, Pat 
Young and Judy Watson.

Little Dribbler Pizza Dinner
The members of the Mi­

nor League team of the Su­
dan Girls’s Little Dribblers 
were honored Tuesday with 
a pizza dinner at the Pizza 
Inn in Littlefield.

Following the meal, the 
girls were served a cake 
that was in the shape of a 
basketball with each girls 
name on it. It was pre­
sented to them by Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Carr.

Each girl was recognized 
by their coaches, Mike 
Fisher and Debbie Maxfield 
with them telling each girl 
how well they had done 
during the season. They 
had a winning season, hav­
ing won two trophies dur­
ing their play.

Each girl received a "Su­
per Star” certificate and an 
“ All-Star” trophy, which 
was purchased by the 
coaches and Loretta Reid.

Members of the team in­
clude Arnie Bake*, Mandy 
Carr, Kay Lynn Gordon, 
Kristi Hargrove, Moneake 
Payne, Ambyr Douuell,

Kendra Fisher, Tanya Fish­
er, Nicole Mayfield, Gayla 
Rasco, Suzanne Reid, Mi­
chelle Tamplin and Diane 
Williams.

Parents of the girls join­
ed the girls and coaches at 
the Pizza Inn.

B IB LE VERSE
"Ye shall not need to 

fight in this battle; set 
yourself, stand still, and 
see the salvation o f the 
Lord with you.

1. Who made the above 
statement?
2. Through whom was he 
speaking?
3. To whom were the 
words addressed?
4. Where may this state­
ment be found?

Aniwere to Bible Verse

1. The Lord Jehovah.
2. Through Jahaziel, a 
Levite.
3. King Jehoshapha* and 
all of Judah.
4. II Chronicles 20:17a.

Do You W ant Beautiful 
Skin & Would You Like To 

Look Years Younger?
Call For A Free Demonstration Of An Excellent 
Skin Care Program And Non-Surgical Face Lift 
That Is Guaranteed To Remove Wrinkles 
And Omits Skin Problems Such As Acne, Skin 
Discolorations & Dry Skin.

This Is For M en And W om en From 

15 To 90  Years. Call For 

A ppointm ent Today

272-4592

First National Bank
«

Offers You A 91 Day
Certificate O f Deposit

With An Interest Rate Tied To The 
13 Week Treasury Bill Rate.

Before now a minimum of $1000,000 was required to 
purchase a certificate of deposit with a m aturity of less 
than 6 months at a favorable rate.

This new Certificate of Deposit offers you the opportunity 
to earn a high rate of interest while investing in shorter 
term Ceriificate of Deposits Vs. the six month money 
market.

r-' '

Beautiful Solid Color 
uxury Towels!

Also the minimum deposit of $7,500 provides you with 
more versatility to work your money.

The new Certificate of Deposit is fully insured and is 
automatically renewable.

The three month certificate could be perfect for you 
if so see the officers at First National Bank, Muleshoe#

1

v)
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Vacation Bible School
May 31 - June 4

9:30 - 11:30 a.m.

Christian

ummer Sizzler!
This Coupon Good For $100. Toward

r

Your P at W alker Program

Good Through June 15

3 up on *

• S /,

Annual Spring Piano 
Recital Held Friday

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED--Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Hicks of Muleshoe announce the engagement and ap­
proaching marriage of their daughter, Tammye Cecelia 
to Jack Wesley Barber, son of Mr. and Mrs. Bud Barber 
of Hugo, Oklahoma. Barber is the grandson of Mr. and 
Mrs. j .  W. Barber and Mrs. V. G. Latham of Muleshoe. 
Vows will be exchanges July 24, at the First United 
Methodist Church of Muleshoe.

Iilaine Damron presented 
her piano pupils in their 
annual spring recital on 
Friday, Mcy 7 at 8 p.m. in 
the fellowship hall of the 
First United Methodist 
Church. After their perfor­
mance, the awards for the 
year were presented.

Mrs. Damron’s special 
'"h ighest” awards for this 
year went to the following: 
Highest Primary Theory 
.(school grades 1;3): D’Anne 
Box and Dayna Hamilton; 
Highest Whitlock Theory 
(school grades 4-12): Hea­
ther Hutton; Most Practice 
Hours: Stacy McElroy; and 
Highest Guild Grade: Ken 
Craft.

The theory tests were ad­
ministered through the 
Texas Music Teachers As­
sociation and fourteen theo­
ry medals were earned by 
Mrs. Damron's pupils this 
year. Those receiving pri­

mary theory medals were 
the following: Gold (grade 
of 98-100): D’Annc Box, 
Lashelle Scoggin, Jeremy 
Bruns, Dayna Hamilton and 
Amy Turner; Silver (grade 
of 95-97): Corley Hutton; 
Bronze (grade of 90-94): 
Jason Box. Those receiving 
Whitlock Theory medals 
were the following: Gold: 
Heather Hutton and Ali 
Cage; Silver: Lisa Hamil­
ton, Kelly Sue Hamblen, 
Mercedes Sayago; Bronze: 
Selina Gonzales and Sherri 
Kinard.

Piano Guild certificates 
were presented to the fol­
lowing: International win­
ners (15-20 memorized pie­
ces): Jeremy Bruns, Selina 
Gonzales, Dayna Hamilton, 
Lisa Hamilton, Heather 
Hutton and Amy Turner. 
National winners (10 - 15 
memorized pieces! D’Anne 
Box, Ali Cage, Ken Craft,

T'H Hamilton, Corley Hut- 
t°kn, Debbie Isaac, Stacy 
McElroy and Lashelle Scog­
gin. Hobbyist (7-8 memori­
zed pieces): Kelly Sue 
Hamblen and Sherri
Kinard.

Those performing in the 
recital were Corley Hutton, 
D'Anne Box, Lashelle Scog­
gin, Debbie Isaac, Stacy 
McElroy, Amy Turner, 
Quay Gregory, Marlcea
Cox, Jeremy Bruns, Jill 
Hamilton, Dayna Hamilton,
Sherri Kinard, Heather
Hutton, Ali Cage, Lisa 
Hamilton, Selina Gonzales, 
Ken Craft and Kelly Sue 
Hamblen.

Evidently
Stranger-The postmaster 

here seems to be informed 
about all parts of the world. 
Has he traveled much?

Citizen-No, but he has 
received a liberal education 
from the picture postcards.

No Hone
Vegetable Peddler--''Any 

horseradish, madam?”
Young Bride—"No, thank 

you! We have a car.”

Senior Citizen £ "La Thcrc ,isalso a map snowing the

Extravaganza 
Scheduled

The Bailey County Senior 
Citizens will be meeting at 
the Methodist Church at 
7:30 a.m. Thursday. May
27, to go to Lubbock. The 
Bailey County Senior Citi­
zen Van will be at the 
church to take people who 
need a ride. There will also 
be extra cars for the ones 
who don’t ride the van.

More information is 
available about the Olym­
pics, through Melba Brat­
cher in the courtlwuse, at

directions for getting to thev jj I |
Olympics in Lubbock.

Wear comfortable clo­
thing and tennis shoes or 
crepe sole shoes. There will 
be a meal provided, the 
price is S2 per ticket. You 
will have a choice of a 
chicken or a fish plate.

All the first place win­
ners in the local Senior Cit­
izen Olympics are asked to 
take your entries to Lub­
bock. There will be a table 
for Bailey County to set up 
their entries. Prizes will be 
given to the best looking 
table. So get ready for a 
day of fun in Lubbock on 
May 27.
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MM
Men may differ in 

opinions but they should 
not dispute as to facts.

• • * •
Most people can stand 

tragedy but few can 
master the small irrita­
tions of life.

*  • • •

Nothing speeds up 
work like trie idea of get­
ting through for a chance 
to take a rest.

* •  *  •
No one holds more 

strongly to an opinion 
than a man of little in­
tellect.

MM
There are men and 

women who play so hard 
that they are too weary to 
work.

Ruth Sunday 
School Class 
Meeting Held

Members of the Ruth 
Sunday School class of the 
Sudan First Baptist Church 
held their regular meeting 
Monday, May 10 in the fel­
lowship hall.

Frances Gardner was the 
hostess for the salad sup­
per. A devotional "God, 
Who Am I” was given by 
Precious Johnson.

Plans were made for the 
May birthday party for re­
sidents at the Amherst 
Manor with Rosemary Sey­
more, president, presiding.

Those attending were 
Jean Harvey, Mary Harper, 
Billye Doty, Sue Whitaker, 
Evelyn Ritchie, Rosemary 
Seymore, Elsie Seymore, 
Gwen West, Frances Gard­
ner and Precious Johnson.

* * * *
Just because a man is 

a good sport doesn 't 
necessarily mean he is a . 
good man.

fe rtrlo m e
$2.98 Hose-on Sprayer

with the quart purchase of

Baker Farm Supply 
1532 W. Amer. Blvd. 

272-4613

SPRING RECITAL -A group of twirlers who are students of Sue Bessire and Debbie Cloud 
will be performing at the annual spring recital of Hawkins and Purdy School of Dance to 
be held Thursday, May 27 at 7:30 p.m. in the Muleshoe High School Auditorium. No 
admission will be charged. Back row (L-R) Tina Copley, Charla Holt, Rebecca Gonzales 
and Lupida Pineda. Not pictured, Mandy Collins.

Hobby 
Club

The Muleshoe Hobby 
Club met Thursday, May 
20 in the community room 
of the Muleshoe State 
Bank.

Sammie Ethridge, presi­
dent, presided over the 
meeting, with 16 members 
and one visitor, Frances 
Bruns, present.

Ruth Bass thanked the

Are You Fat?
Is your life  m iserable because of a w eight problem? 

A re you having health problems such as high blood pressure 

or diabetes because you are carrying ex tra  w eight?

fhere is a solution to your problem. Pat Walkers offers no miracle cure 

for being fa t, just a good healthy weight loss program. Learning to eat 

a proper balance of food-eating 3 meals a day and a passive exercise

program to increase circulction and firm and tone tissue. Enroll in 

Summer School to become thin and learn to maintain your proper weight.

Call Now -Don't Procrastinate I

Insure yourself for good health and an attractive appearance

club for the gift and card, 
signed by all the members 
during her illness. A gift 
was also sent to Clara Jane 
Williams, who is in the 
hospital.

Hostesses for the coming 
year were read.

Articles on display 
were "Everlasting Rose” of 
wood fiber, pictures in an 
antique auto framed, egg­
shell decorated jewelry box, 
quickpoint Kleenex box co­
ver, crochet table place 
mats, 18 inch rag doll, bath 
room tissue holder, fruit jar 
filled with fruit drops and 
topped with a bonnet, 
quickpoint phone book cov­
er, miniature outhouse, a 
music box, doublcknit quilt 
in red and pink, latchhook 
pillow, artex wall hanging, 
four crochet pot holders.

The hostess gift was 
drawn* by Myrtle Cham- 
bless. It was a kitchen to­
wel ensemble.

Mrs. Mae 1.0yd served 
coffee, soft drinks and pink 
lemo. ade from a blue cer­
amic coffee pot, made by 
her granddaughter. D'Linda 
Evans of Dimmitt.

The next meeting will be 
on June 2 with Edith Fox 
as hostess.

, These 
Maytags 

Really

P erfect For Dad Or The G raduate!

W R IT E  ON T IM E ... 
W ITH  A  PEN W A TC H

Here’s an idea fo r anyone who needs more tim e on their hands: This sleek 
ballpoint pen has a digital watch readout that gives the hour, minute, second, 
plus the month and date. The watch operates on a 1.5 volt silver oxide 
ba tte ry, which comes included. Choose from Silver stainless steel, 
or Goldtone and Black.

Regular $13.

Open 9 to  6 
321 M ain Street

T’r r r r r r r r r r r r r r v r r y r i  i  T r r r r r r r r r r r r n n r iTTTr r r r r r i y i T r r r i i

Figure Perfection Salons International 
C  272-4591

Your Authorized 
Sales & Service 

Dealer

HNHMKs
122 S. 1st 
2723030

•  Classes For All Ages
( Toddlers - Adults I

•  Free No Charges, Fees

•  Bible - Centered Lessons

•  Qualified Teachers

•  Daily Refreshments

•  Call 965-2932
For Pre-Registeration

Lazbuddie Chruch Of Christ

Everyone Welcome!
^ i n m i m i i i i H > m H >»>i i n > m i .m n m >i i i n i m i n i n i i i i n n , i l i , n t i 1 . ^ 1 |tl)t|) j
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Loam...
Cont. from Page 1 

their acreages as yet. “ Al­
though a farmer does not 
want to participate in the 
1982 farm program, he still 
needs to certify his acres.

Tax...
Cant, from Page 1

Paso received $1.9 million.
Bullock also forwarded 

May rebates to the state's 
^two Metropolitan Transit 

Authorities. The Houston 
MTA received $22.2 million 
bringing the total received 
this year to $74.7 million. 
The San Antonio MTA got 
a check for $2.7 million, 
bringing the 1982 rebate 
total to $9 million.

The city and MTA sales 
taxes are collected along 
with the state sales tax by 
merchants and rebated 
monthly to the cities in 
which they are collected by 
the Comptroller.

, Muleshoe, Texas, Sunday, May 73, 1982
Certifying now will help to Even the 
protect a producer’s yields 
in the future,” the Director 
said.

Grain deficiency checks 
should be delivered to 
county producers in the 
near future.

The county reports shows 
that all set aside wheat was 
clipped, grazed, hayed or 
plowed by May 15, 1982 in 
accordance with require­
ments. Spot checks on this 
will be starting soon, and 
producers should take care 
to make sure that they are 
in compliance.

Aerial measurement on 
1982 wheat will begin 
shortly. Producers will have 
five days to certify their 
wheat after the measure­
ment service is performed.
Final certification dates will 
be typed on the measure­
ment forms that are recei­
ved by producers. •

Another item of concern 
is that of the disaster ap­
plication,. said Williamson.

program is not 
this year, producers still 
need to report acres affec­
ted by natural disaster. 
This reporting must be 
done before the crop is de­
stroyed. Reporting these 
disasters will protect your 
planted acreage credit in 
the event any type of defi­
ciency payments are forth­
coming or offered.

disaster Oil...

MULESHOE LITTLE LEAGUE BASEBALL

STANDINGS

M a jo r

5/20/82

League

Sox 1 0 1.000
Mustangs 1 0 1.000
Longhorns 1 0 1.000
Savers 1 1 500
L io n s 0 1 000
K -B a r s 0

Minor

2

League

000

D o l l a r  B i l l s 1 0 1.000
Shorthorns 1 0 1 000
F i r e b a l l s 1 0 1.000
G inners 1 1 .500
B ea r s 0 1 .000
U -B a rs 0 2 000

T - B a l l  League

Red 2 0 1.000
Orange 1 0 1.000
Green* 1 0 •75 0
Go ld 1 1 .500
B lu e 1 1 .500
P u rp le * 0 0 250
Maroon 0 2 .000
Lazbudd ie 0 2 .000

• t i e  b a l l  game inc luded
in percen tages

Graduate...
Cont. from Page 1 

ing and Gloria Recio, gen­
eral secretary.

Nancy Allison received 
an associate of science de­
gree in education.

Maple students receiv­
ing degrees included Be­
linda Dollc, associate of 
applied science, computer 
information systems, with 
honors; F. Parkman, asso­
ciate of applied science, 
auto mechanics; Milzi Alt­
man, associate of science, 
pre-pharmacy; and Belin­
da Richardson, associate 
of science, education, with 
honors.

Tammy Davis of Three 
Way received an associate 
of science degree in phy­
sical education.

The number of 1982 
graduates ties the colleges 
record number set last
year. The graduates are 
from all SPC campuses - 
Levelland. Lubbock. Plain- 
view and an extension fac­
ility at Reese Air Force 
Base near Lubbock.

Dr. Bud Joyner, dean of 
arts and sciences, confer­
red associate degrees on 
academic graduates, and 
Frank Hunt, dean of the 
Technical-Vocational-Occu­
pational Division certified 
technical - vocational stu­
dents.

Lazbuddie...
Cont. from Page 1 

Pat McBroom, tenor sax, 
and Clint Russell, tuba, 
with Monica Locke, Cami 
Ivy and Shonda Mitchell 
earning second divisions on 
clarinet solos, and Dust«n 
Jesko eartrng a second on 
cornet solo.

The band played Our Di­
rector March, Royal Fire­
work Music and Stately 
Mansions for their concert 
selections.

G 7 !n n I Q 2 2 B i t s Efl&OK
T R U C K S

■ (■ loadI
SAVINGS

V c i t l i
3  DAYS ONLY
The
All-Weather
Radial.

Prlcot good through W o d n .td a y
SUGGESTED SALE

SIZE EXCHANGE PRICE
P185-14 •79.95 •55.50
P195-14 90.96 59.50
P20S-14 93.95 65.50
P215-14 97.95 66.50
P205-15 95.96 66.50
P J 15-15 99.9C 60.50
P225-15 94.95 71.50
P235-15 100.95 74.50
FET: '2.04-2.93 WHITEWALL

P155-13 
B l.ckw .ll 
FET: '1.55 
Exchange

F R E E  M O U N T IN G !

M A N H A N D L E R  7 0  R A D IA L
AS LOW AS

8 8SAVE §
2 5 % P175/70R13 

FET: *1.88

White Trailduster 
Wheels

Wheel Alignment

s18.88

4 for s99

Cont. from Page 1 
gue 196.

Mary Paul O'BTien and 
husband, John O'Brien to 
W. Wayne Gill -- All of 
Labors 3,4,5,6,7,8,14 and 
25; Lubbock COunty School 
Lands; League 1%.

Raymond Austin Sr. to 
W. Wayne Gill — Floyd 
County School Land; Lea­
gue 182, Labor 72 and La­
bor 90.

Harvev Blackstone and 
wife, Bonnie Joe Black- 
stone -  All of Labor 69, 
League 182, Fisher County 
School Land.

Willis James and wife, 
Mildred James, Eleanor 
Faye James Shadden, Shel- 

{by Elaine James Bray and 
Carla Willis James Posey 
to W. Wayne Gill -  (SW/- 
4) of Section 27, Block Z, 
State Capitol Lands.

Muleshoe...
Cont. from Page 1 

Broadway, Lubbock, Texas
79401.

. . .
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Don 

Williams, Justin. Julie and 
Jerad of Abilene were in 
Muleshoe to attend gradua­
tion exercises, and visiting 
relatives and friends.

. . .
SISgt. and Mrs. Randy 

Williams, Cathie and Ran­
dy Lee have returned to 
their home at Ft. Bliss, El 
Paso.

Mrs. Williams and the 
two children spent the past 
two months in the home of 
his mother, Cleta Williams, 
while Sgt. Williams attend­
ed a school at Ft. Sill, Ok­
lahoma.

*«•
There wilt be a women’s 

softball interest group 
meeting on Wednesday 
May 28 at 7 p.m. in the 
Corral Restaurant. All in­
terested women are urged 
to attend.

. . .
The Muleshoe Ladies 

Golf Association will hold 
their annual “ Naomi St. 
Clair-Marie White Memor­
ial Tournament at the 
Mules.ioe Country Club on 
Sunday, May 13. There is a 
$5 entry fee for partici­
pants! Tee off iTmc Is 1 
p.m. For more information 
call Dorothy St. Clair, tour­
nament chairman. This is 
an individual handicap 
tournament.

*•*
The 1982 Annual conven­

tion of the Texas Cattle 
Feeders Association is 
scheduled for November 7- 
10.

This year’s convention 
will be headquartered at 
the Hyatt Regency, Austin.

***
Steven Block, son of Dr. 

and Mrs. Burel Block, who 
arc formerly of Muleshoe, 
will graduate from Baylor 
College of Medicine June 
4. The commencement ex­
ercises will be held at 
Jessie H. Jones Hall in 
Houston. Texas. Blcok will 
be one out of 112 to have 
the doctor of medicine con­
ferred upon him. Block and 
his wife, Melba will go in 
July to Los Angeles County 
Hosptial, University of 
Southern California Medical 
Center where he begins a 
three year residency in In­
ternal Medicine.

Lcldon W. Phillips and 
wife, Alma Phillips to W. 
Wayne Gill (SW/4) of Sec­
tion 28, Block Z, State Cap­
itol Lands.

Bennie F. Stancell and 
wife, Carolyn M. StanccII 
to W. Wayne Gill -  N/2 
SE/4 of Section 37, Block 
Z, State Capitol Lands.

Emma Ruth Vaughn and 
husband, Lewis E. Vaughn 
to W. Wayne Gill -  N/2 
SE/4 of Section 37, Block 
Z, State Capitol Lands.

SPC...
Cont. from Page 1

fine students who have de­
monstrated the academic 
excellence which is found 
at South Plains College,” 
said Dr. Bud Joyner, dean 
of arts and sciences. “ We 
arc always proud of the 
students who are named to 
the President’s and Dean’s 
Honor Lists at SPC.”

A total of 153 students 
were named to the Presi­
dent’s List for the spring 
and 242 students were 
named to the Dean’s Honor 
List.

Democrats...
Coni, from Page 1 

be made to the needy, el­
derly and those on food 
stamps.

7) Aliens should not be 
allowed to come to the U. 
S. and work for a short 
time, then return to their 
native country and retire on 
Social Security where they 
are not checked for legal­
ity, age or whether they 
are still alive.

8) Be it resolved that we,

Raider...
Cont. from Page 1 

guests.
All non-golfers are urged 

to attend this event, re­
gardless of school affiliation 
and are asked to contact 
the Pro Shop at the Mule­
shoe Country Club for re­
servations.

Chairman for the special 
day Max King said that 
they “ hoped to have a 
good local turnout and urg­
ed everyone, whether a 
golfer or not to come out 
and enjoy the day.”

the people of Bailey Coun­
ty, want the government to 
do anything possible to 
stimulate the agricultural
economy. We feel that in­
action by the government 
will cause a total economic 
collapse in our area.

9)Be it re s o lv e d  th a t  th e  
Bailey County D e m o c r a t ic  
convention endorses th e  
idea of a Constitutional 
Amendment requiring the 
Federal Government to  
maintain a balanced budget 
except in times of a na­
tional emergency.

Delegates who attended 
the local convention were 
Charles Smith, Nelda Mer- 
riott, Linda Guelker, Gor­
don Green, Jim Crawford, 
George Harlan, J. F. Fer­
guson, Mrs. J. F. Ferguson 
Hugh Young and Margar-

105...
Cont. from Pjge I

and Clara Barton. Rev. 
Meeks left the class with 
this thought: “ Will you be 
the young men and women 
who keep knocking until 
the closed doors are open­
ed? You will be . . . If, it 
can be said of you: Beware 
for the great God has let 
loose on this planet some 
young lives who are com­
mitted to think for Him. 
live for Him and do for 
Him.”

As the members of the 
class attired in their robes 
and mortar boards crossed 
the stage and then filed out 
of the room, one could not 
help but feel that the swit­
ching of the tassle 
more than a gesture.

was

etlie Taylor.
Vaccinating shrim p increases production

COLLEGE STATION — In 
(he first field experiment of its 
kind, a Texas A&M University 
veterinary microbiologist has 
su c c e s s fu lly  im m u n iz e d  
saltwater shrimp against harm- 
hil bacteria.

The immunity lasted through 
harvest, and production was

greater in the ponds containing 
im m u n ized  Pacific w hite 
shrimp, said Dr. Donald Lewis.

The experiment was part of 
the continuing research pro­
gram at Texas A&M’s shrimp 
mariculture center near Corpus 
Christi.

2 DAY AUCTION SALE
H t  W HI? COMPANY

HIGHWAY 114 NORTH fP6£ OF MULESHOE. TEXAS

FRIDAY. (DAY 28 • 1 :0 0  P.M.
AIFAIA HAY CUBES, CUBERS, TRUCKS, LOADERS, RADIOS, REAL ESTATE

SATURDAY. MAY 29  • 1 0 :0 0  A.M.
SHOT EQUIPMENT

>>'•••*• *"•» •> >*• «•«* «« wnawitoyU.waik.wMrt

THIS IS A  RASE O ffO R T U N IT Y  TO BUY AT R U IU C  A U C TIO N  THIS O U AU TY O f EQUIPM ENT. 
A U  THIS EQUIPMENT W AS M ADE FIEIO  READY FOR THIS SEASON. A N O  THE M ECHANICAL 
A N D  O UTW ARD APPEARANCE IS VERY G O O D THIS IS THE BEST ONE O f USED EQUIPMENT 
M  THE SOUTHWEST

LUNCH WILL BE AVAILABLE
fU A S E NOTE THE 6 M V  CUBERS WIU BE THE FIRST ITEMS TO BE SOID.

TRUCKS ANO  TRAILERS—CURED HAY—
- a m  T* MB Ti m  oI  C M  AlteMa 

Ha* Dcftoito Turnoff Aamnmad 
Satk Day iTk» Hay Cate* ■  IMI>

C USERS—

1 -4 *  1 D Cater and Trader Cab and 
Air Hydra Drive. Cteto Drive Header

TRUCKS IC o n fin v M i)-
1-1174 Ford l Ten. M  Engine. I  CyM .

SHOP EQUIPMENT
THIS IS VECY GOOD SHOP EQURHENT

i trader has MOM mile* on it 
i  now
I CMC t

TRACTOR -  HAY RAKES -  
SFRAY RIG—

Cater and Trader. Cab r a i  
y converted to hyd t»y Warren

II Speed Trana. Twin Screw IMJ77 
Miles Knitter 7B la M% Power Steer- 
N* and Air

I-IBM Chevy M Senes. 14.BS MUea 
Detroit «U fu rto  Charge Engine i  
Speed Power Steering. 1) ft All Steel 
Bed with Tool B o ra

l-  t«M Mark DM MB Serieo. MB Engne 
- Twin Screw). .M lM  MUea. 
llubter S  ft American Bed and 
Scaaer »  Tun Hottf. 71 »  Stdr-

I -Set of New Holland I

1 -4 *  JD Cater m i Trader Q te and 
Air, aVTl Detroit Engine Fafly caw 
verted to byd by Warren and Baer]

LIVESTOCK EQUIPM ENT—
1—SI Cal Tranquiltaer Gan -ith aft 

I Portable CatOe d a l e  wttb M IS fl
I— i Macb H Modal. ST Engine C

1 W M i

I JD Hay C a t*  and Traitor. Caa 
1 to byd ay V a n *

Engine Majored At 
M f l Ai

vntb »  Toa How(. 73 to tetobox-d*.

£  RADIOS A RASE STATIO N —

- t i l l  Astro GUT SIB Detroit, II  Speed 
T rana. Taw Screw, M.Nt Mliei on 
Engine Major, M ft S M  Bod and 
HmA *  TOn brtooor Hate, 7 | la. *de-

M V P  Poraowat I
note Unit* I—Lot of Q E Mobil Units

CURCR PARTS—

1—1*71 GMC 7MB Cbfrv. I tfM  Miles. .  ____ ______  ___
V*M Engine k and 2 Spaed Trwie. WATER A FUEL TANKS—
Tandem Aasi. B  f l  Owbtn Grain t m  Gal. Water Tank* *  T« 
Bed and Garten Torn Cytd Hate. A

IBM m  Sartos Chary Tract V  I  
-Y U i an Props e with IMB Gal Water

1—1*77 M | |  Qar*1a Tandem 
Trailer wife Hate 71 to I

LOADERS—

I—MeMgan •  III. Cab. « Wheal Drive 
Leader Good Rubber Vary p a d  
Model NTM te r  W O *  tM Delete

CONVEYOR—
M Ft Knew U m a r  win Fard tod 
« cytd Ehgtet Hyd Ml

SHOP AN O  REAL E S T A T f-
B»oe -Legal Uracrlptten Appraa M  ae 
beaded to Bailey Caaaty. Trass apyroaioa

I—I t *  »  f t  Amancan

v-im t r*
MW M

11*74 Chevy I Ton 4S4 Engine on 
Propane to  SM MUe* • »  Gal Fuel 
Tate 71 Gal Hyd Taab. PTO Pump

l-M*B Chevy l TOn. too Engine *4 01

I of toad eat of SW ik of See M ia (Uerti Y, W P  and F W. . 
•  Mol aW Highway III  to (tty Malta of MateoOae Teaas

baa llM B ft Metal Mactear Shed Attached to Mam Binding 

la be paid m faM withinB *  Dawn Day of Auction 
to be an—wired a t sale i

► day* (We reaarve the right to the tend Cubes are stored on 

tract <M of Bertha M. M art V. W D a te  W . W Jatoteaa -----------_  *r-IH M toto. WHH 1-rt to toWto Ann. I M > n MtMIMrt HI, f, 1—P»fb

1—Lot 1 in. Pipe, Several 100 ft.
1—Lot of I in. Pipe 
1—Lot of New and Used Angles and 

Flab
1— Steel Racks. A  ft.
2— Portable Lincoln 225 Amp. Welders 
1—Portable Air Compressor, 10 hr. Gas

Motor
1—Air Greas* Gun 
1—Pump Type Transmission Gun 

im ww rmc sum 1—High Pressure Hot Water Washer. 
Citiatien, 2 Years Old 
Lot of Hyd. Jacks 

1—20 Ton Shopmade Press. Good 
1—Cabinet of Asst. Sbe Bolls New 
1—Ice Making Machine. High Capacity, 

Makes S00 Lbs. Per Day 
1—Eench Grinder on Stand 
l—Crider J bp Motor, SO. 2 Phaae 
1—20 Ton Floor Jack
3— Merco Torches, Gauges and Hoses 
1-Cutting Torch Cart, 2 Wheel 
1-3 Wheel Bottle Cart

£ £ «  1—Lincoln 22S Amp Elect. Welder 
I—Medium Sire Anvil

MiscfUANfOUS- 1—Metal Shop Table, 3x9
1—Milton Bench Vise

IZSTVST I-Large Asst of Welding Rod
’- S i 0** p“  “  » 1-Power Hacksaw
.-u. V1** TV. 1—Makita Cutoff Saw on Stand

1—Chicago Drill Press, H Chuck, on 
Stand

1-Air Compressor. 2 Cyld. 5 HP Motor 
I—Portable A Frame on Wheels 
1—1 Ton Chain Hoist 

t». 1—Barrel Rack

t—Pans Wadi Tub am 2 Wheel Dolly 
2—Creeper*
2—Metal Sawhorses
1—Duro Drill Press an Stand 
1-Large Aaat of Drill Bib. All Sixes 
S—Aluminum Landers 
1-Set 2 Wheel DM!,
1—JD Battery Charger 
l— Rodvee % Air Wrench 
1 - *  Drill 
1—Air Sander 
l—Vk in. Drill

f**

1—M i OH Furl T«n» m  I  W tarl M r

G R IN D E R  t  S iG  ELECTRIC 
M O T O R S -

2—Auto Ramps
1—10 Ton Floor Jack
1-Walker 1 Ton Cherry Picker Hoist

1— Blinks Faint Gun
2— Se'T \  Socket Seb 
I—Lot Extension Cords 
I—Lot Tool Boxes 
1—Bearing Puller 
1—3 by I ft. Shop Bench, Metal 
1—Milton Vise 
1—Lot Drop Lights 
l—Large Asst, of Hand Tools 
1—Toot Cabinet 
1—Rotunda 235 Amp Welder 
1—Large Asst, of Bolts, New 
1—Portable Shop Heater 
1—Lot of Truck Lug Wrenches 
I—Lot of Chain Binders 
1—Lot of Chains 
1-Lot of Booster Cables 
1—Small Portable Air Compressor. Ga

Engine
I—Lot of Shop Hammers 
I—Lot of C Gamps 
1—Lot of New Hand Tools 
1—Lot of New Bolts 
1-Lot of Oil and Grease

-OTHER ITEMS TOO NUMEROUS 
MENTION

nil

M i  W MAT CO 
SO* 7 7 1 -3 *2 $

FO« FURTHIt INFORMATION FHONI 
T fD  HARRISON 
*0 6  272-3615

O f M A C * W A G N O N  
•0 6  272-3203

| ml W ,  C A IN  AH A r t * . I h, w u *“>1 tmm. m !k~tkruk.

SALE CONDUCT® BY

TOM FLOWERS AUCTION SERVICE
T r t u  t i n u i t a t  __________ ______TO N  FIOW FRS 

TXS-013-0134
•0 6  372-4154  

N U U S H O f. T IX A S

1 5  X  7

•Set toe-in 
•Inspect tires 
•Adjust caster 
and camber Most cars

JO H N  W ELDON SM ITH 
lic w n *  N o 205752-01

T'mes are changing and so are 
interest rates. That s why we want 
you to make every cent you can 
on the money you invest.

Our 91 day Money Market Cer­
tificates* will pay you a good 
return with a minimum deposit of 
$7500. Interest rates are compar­
able to current treasury bills and 
will remain fixed for the 91 day 
term of the certificate.

Ask about our 3 Vi year (42 month) Money 
Market Certificates, too. Interest rates vary every 2 
weeks and require a $500 minimum deposit You 
can make additional deposits without extendinq 
their term.

V  . <

P ric .s  good through W »dn»»day

CHOOKs301 North First • 272-3420 
Manager: John Robinson

“the only way to go!

Serving Texas for 50 years
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Commencement Held Friday Evening

MONDAY 
Breakfust 

f ilk 
Cereal 
fruit 
[unch 
I ilk

Skillet Dinner 
Torn
}reen Beans 
Torn Bread 
•ruit

TUESDAY
breakfast
ililk
loney Buns 
uice 
.unch 
dilk
Sandwiches 
’ork & Beans 

potato Chips 
r ru it

FHAFun Picnic
r
. Future Homemakers of 
America had an end of the 
year picnic at the city park 
bn Thursday, May 13.
' Hot dogs, hamburgers, 
and marshmallow chocolate 
treats were prepared on the 
grill.

Afterwards the group en-

f* >yed games led by, Tiya 
uthardt, Shelly -Sain, and 

Kristi Campbell. Games in­
cluded volleyball, relays 
and sack races.

Charlotte Morris was 
general chairman for the

Ind of the year function, 
he was assisted by Kanda 
lasOn and Gloria Chavez.

| * * * * * * * * * * * * * *

jappy B irthday,
* * * * * * * * * * * * 1

The annual staff would 
like to wish the following 
people a very happy birth­
day:

i May 23-Danny Mendoza 
| May 24-Rob Donaldson 
Erminia Martinez.

May 27-Yolanda Vasquez 
May 30-Rudy Orozco, 

Trent Kirven 
May 31-Carlos Carmo.ia. 
The Annual staff wishes 

a happy birthday to all the 
people with summer birth­
days.

FFA Officers
Elected

Gold chains continue to 
be in style. There It em­
phasis on the different iyp*s 
of links. Strike it rich by 
adding gem stones, g° 
coins and geometric designs 
to chains. ^

“Getting Reedy”

Jr-Sr Banquet BigSuccess

The freshmen, sopho­
more and junior members 
of the Muleshoe FFA met 
and elected officers for the 
1982-83 school year. The 
meeting was held Thurs­
day, May 13. in the High 
School Ag building at 7 
pm .

The new officers are Kim 
Fanrer. president; Todd 
Holt, vice president; Dee 
Kinard, secretary: Tamara 
Gilliland, reporter. Michael 
Barrett, treasurer; Eddie 
Flowers, sentinel; Raj Vin­
son, parliamentarian; Todd 
Jones, historian and Steve 
Cavitt, chaplain. They were 
installed Thursday morn­
ing, May 20, at 8:00 a.m.

Congratulations to these 
students for being elected 
to an FFA office.

Upon entering the Great 
, Barrier Reef the visitor re­
ceived a ticket to his or her 
table, which represented 
the ships: Sloop Jay, S.S. 
Delaware, Lynx, Sophia, 
Harold, Pathfinder, De 
Braak, Condor. Merida, 
Central America, Phantom 
and Venus. After getting 
the ticket with information 
about the ship, the passen­
gers made their way 
through a dark cave cover­
ed in seaweed and algae. 
When through the cave the 
passenger found the spec­
tacular ocean with sky blue 
walls and French saffire 
ceiling. Captain Jeff Ham­
ilton and First Mate Mary 
Ann Ybarra greeted each 
person. The guests were 
seated at their ship by the 
sophomore servers, dressed 
in pirate and mate suits. 
The boys wore raggedy 
jeans and white shirts with 
bandanas while the girls 
wore blue and white strip­
ed sailor shirts with white 
jeans and sailor hats.

After being seated the 
juniors, seniors and guests 
went to the salad bar to 
start off their voyage fcas', 
wh.le they enjoyed the de­
corations. The decorations 
included schools of fish, 
sharks, squids, rays, and 
other sea animals. One cor­
ner of the cafeteria was 
filled with a great coral 
reef with treasures of gold 
on it. Six gigantic brightly 
coloied fish swam away 
from the reef and into an­
other comer. The school of 
fish siowly faded out to 
meet the "Endeavor,” a

HECE 
Welcomes
New Students

The incoming HECE stu­
dents were honored with a 
luncheon in the cooking lab 
on Monday, May 17. The 
lunch, a Mexican Fiesta, 
was prepared by the HECE 
students during first and 
fourth period classes.

An interview workshop 
was provided for the new 
students. They were in­
formed on how to dress, 
speak, and project themsel­
ves at an interview. They 
were shown filmstrips, had 
classroom discussions, and 
were given literature.

The students ended the 
meeting by making brown­
ies.

famous sunken ship which 
was the main stage for the 
program. A great clam 
opened up during the ban­
quet to show off two small 
mermaids, Kristi and Misti 
Taylor.

An octopus was in the 
far back comer. The octo­
pus was very large and was 
green, black and pink. Two 
big, green seahorses dan­
ced behind the ships while 
the people ate. The fish, 
seahorses, and octopus 
were the main predators of 
the scenic ocean floor. And 
they seemed to float with 
an elegant and artist ? 
wave of the sea; reflecting 
the delicate life of the 
ocean and the imagination 
of the evening itself.

After a large tugboat 
made its way above head 
while blowing its horn 
loudly, Michael Isaac, mas­
ter of ceremonies, opened 
the program. Charli Haw­

kins gave the welcome and 
Curtis Wheeler gave the |

^senior fRpfltVSeT Start I
Campbell gave the invoca- f 
tion, and the meal was ser­
ved.

The meal was fish, hush- 
puppies, potatoes, beans 
and ice tea. Last, but not 
least, was crab (cherry) 
cobbler.

Entertainment was pre­
sented by "Cimarron,” a 
group from Lubbock Chris­
tian College and by the 
“ Undersea Players,” K - K 
Flowers, Sherri Bessire, 
Jay Cage and Darin Shaw.

Rhonda Dunham gave 
the senior tribute and the 
junior and senior sponsors 
were given special recogni­
tion and small gifts. Mr. 
Keith Taylor, Mrs. Jamie 
Thrasher, Mr. Stephen 
Johnson and Mrs. Pat 
Black were the recipients.

Rooin Burgess closed the 
banquet with a prayer.

ANXIOUSLY AWAITING-Miileshoe High School seniors 
anxiously awaiting their turn to receive their diplomas at 
graduation exercises Friday evening.

Those who have most to 
do, and are willing to 
work, will find the 
most time.

-Samuel Smiles.

He that is busy is tempt­
ed by but one devil; he 
that is idle, by a 
legion.

•Thomas Fuller.

One hundred five MHS 
seniors graduated from 
high school Friday, May 
21. The Baccalaureate and 
Commencement exercises 
were held at 8:00 p.m. in 
the Junior High School 
gymnasium. Stage decora­
tions carried out the class 
colors, yellow and orange, 
and the class flower, the 
yellow rose.

The Mighty ‘M’ Band, 
under the direction of Mr. 
Eddie Chance, played the 
Processional and Recession­
al, "Pomp and Circumstan­
ce”  by Elgar. They also 
played special music "Em- 
parata” by Claude T. 
Smith.

Student Body President 
Jan Whitt gave the invoca­
tion, followed by the Pled­
ge of Allegiance to the 
Flag, led by Curtis Wheel­
er, President of the Senior 
Class. The audience joined 
in singing "The Star Span­
gled Banner.” Mr. Way- 
land Ethridge, high school 
principal, made announce­
ments and invited those 
present to attend the recep­
tion honoring the seniors, 
which was held in the high 
school cafeteria immediate­
ly following commence­
ment.

Mr. Harold Home, Su­
perintendent of Schools, in­
troduced the speaker. Rev. 
J. E. Meeks, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church, deliv­
ered the Baccalaureate Ser­
mon. (

The Salutatory address 
was given by Salutatorian 
Susie Pierce, and the Val­
edictory address was given 
by Valedictorian Cindy Tur­
ner.

Scholarships and awards 
were presented by Principal 
Wayland Ethridge, who al­
so presented the Class of 
1982. The diplomas were 
awarded by School Board 
members Mr. E. Jim Sha­
fer, Mr. Royce Harris and 
Mr. Ben Roming.

Following the singing of 
the Class Song, "Theme 
From Mahogany,” by Gof- 
tin and Masser, the Bene­
diction was given by Elder 
Don Martin of the Primitive 
Baptist Church.

The Class Motto by Es­
ther Baldwin York is:

Like ships afloat on the 
great deep,

we sail on the ocean of
Life,

each following his own 
particular star.

And whether we drift, or 
flounder,

or reach our port,
depends on the vessel 

and the pilot.
Senior class officers were 

President Curtis Wheeler, 
Vice-President Ronnie An- 
geley, Secretary-Treasurer 
Susie Pierce, Parliamentar­
ian Wayne Precure and Re­
porter and Student Council 
Representative Lavon Rho­
des Hunt. Sponsors were 
Mr. Stephen Johnson and 
Mrs. Pat Black.

Juniors chosen as Escorts 
for commencement were 
Kellv Bayless and Michael 
Isaac. Ushers were Annette 
Crabtree, Rhonda Dunham, 
Sherry Ellis, Berna Lopez, 
Scott Campbell, Todd Holt, 
Todd Thornton and Roby 
Wilson.

Honor graduates of the 
class of 1982 arc Cindy 
Turner, Susie Pierce, Enc- 
ida Almanza, Dana Brewer, 
Robin Burgess, Cara Bass 
Davenport, Stacey Camp­
bell, Shelley Davis, Kevin 
Dudley, Kristi Henry, Kan­
da Mason, Rhonda Mills, 
Wayne Precure, Lavon 
Rhodes Hunt, Jill Turner, 
Curtis Wheeler and Jan 
Whitt.

Scholarship recipients al­
so were announced. Cindy 
Turner. Valedictorian, re­
ceives one year free tuition 
to the Texas state-support­

ed college of her choice; 
and she was also the reci­
pient of a Muleshoe State 
Bank scholarship in the 
amount of S2.

Susie Pierce, Salutatorian 
is the recipient of a First 
National Bank scholarship 
in the amount of $250 and 
a National Honor Society 
scholarship in the amount 
of $50.

Curtis Wheeler received 
a scholarship from the
Muleshoe Study Club in 
the amount of $200.

Eneida Almanza was the 
recipient of the Immaculate 
Conception Catholic Church 
scholarship in the amount 
of $300. Kristi Henry recei­
ved a Muleshoe Kiwanis 
Club scholarship in the
amount of $250.

Jan Whitt was the reci­
pient of the Muleshoe 
School Board and Adminis­
tration scholarship in the 
amount of $250, a Firs, Na­
tional Bank scholarship in 
the amount of $250, and a 
National Honor Society 
scholarship in the amount 
of $50.

Tim Sain was the reci­
pient of a First National 
Bank scholarship in the
amount of $250.

Rhonda Mills received 
the Muleshoe Classroom 
Teachers Association scho­
larship in the amount of 
$100. Jill Turner received a 
scholarship from the Texas 
Tech Ex-Students Associa­
tion in the amount of 
$ 1,000.

Alan Harrison received a 
$250 scholarship in memory 
of Jerry Lawrence, and 
Sandra Graves received a 
$250 scholarship from the 
Pat Zimmerman Lawrence 
memorial scholarship.

Jimmy Green received a 
scholarship for $250 pre­
sented by Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Holt in memory of 
Johnny Nichols.

Monty Hysinger was the 
recipient of the Muleshoe 
Rotary Club scholarship in 
the amount of $300. Staci 
Vandiver received a $400 
scholarship from Bailey 
County Electric Coopera­
tive.

Kent Reynolds was the 
recipient of a scholarship in 
the amount of $250 from 
the Muleshoe Kiwanis 
Club.

WTSU Scholars Awards 
of $200 each were received 
by National Society mem-

******* *********

i  Calendar i
* Of Events »
*** ★ * ★ ★ ★ ★ *** ★ ★ ★ *

Monday-May 24 - Semester 
exams, Period 1,2,3 
Tuesday, 25 - Semester Ex­
ams, Period 4,5,6 
Last Day of School. 
Wednesday - 26 - In Ser­
vice Day for teachers. 
Students pick up report 
cards.

bets Dana Brewer, Shelley 
Davis, Kristi Henry, Susie 
Pierce, Wayne Precure, 
Cindy Turner, Jan Whitt 
Curtis Wheeler and Robin 
Burgess, who was also the 
recipient of a Scholars 
Award from Angelo State 
University in the amount of 
$ 1,000.

1982 graduates are Eric 
Blaine Allison, Maria Enei­
da Almanza, Joe Alvarado, 
Ronnie J. Angeley, Stacey 
Kayl Barnhill, Regina Bea­
trice Bevers, Starla Dawn 
Black, Alan Bracey, Tami 
Dawn Bratcher, Dana Jan 
Brewer, Robin Marcel Bur­
gess, Mary Ann Burton, 
Valeria Lynn Callaway, Sta­
cey Lynn Campbell (who 
spent her senior year as a 
Rotary Exchange student to 
Norway). Margarita Car­
mona Alcaine, Jesse Bara 
Carrion, Will James Chan- 
cey, Casey Leigh Gements, 
Nettie Coleman, John Da­
vid Davis, Shelley Ray Da­
vis, Cara Evonne Bass Da­
venport, Israel Del Toro, 
Mark Allen Denney, Kevin 
Clinton Dudley, Sheri Ann 
Ellard, Mary Magdalene 
Espinoza, Frankie Alan 
Fine, Maria Dolores Flores, 
April Lynn Freeman, Gra­
de Perez Garcia, Kim 
Wade Gatewood, Jacinda 
Lynn Gleason, Ella Louise 
Graves, Sandra Pearl Gra­
ves, James E. Green, Den- 
na Marie Harris. Alan 
Blake Harrison, Lori Kay 
Hartline, Donna Jean Haw­
kins, Kristi Diane Henry,

FFA
Spotlight
The FFA Spotlight this 

week is on Jamie LeFebre. 
Jamie is 16 years old and 
the daughter of Jim and 
Lena LeFebre. She is also a 
freshman and is in Ag 1.

Jamie served as the Sec­
retary of the Greenhand 
Chapter Conducting Team. 
She raises and shows pigs 
for a project. Jamie is a 
hard worker and a real as­
set to the FFA Chapter.

Congratulations Jamie.

Pylant Honored 
At Breakfast

Tuesday, May 18, at 7:30 
a.m., the Blackburn-Moore 
Chapter of FTA hosted a 
breakfas; for the MHS fac­
ulty in the Homemaking 
department. Served to the 
faculty were scrambled 
eggs, bacon, sausage, hot 
biscuits, juice and coffee.

FTA members who help­
ed with the breakfast were 
Jeff Hamilton, Scott Camp­
bell, Kristi Campbell, Kelly 
Baylcss, Rhonda Dunham, 
John David Agee, Ronny 
Cox and Sherri Ellis.

The teacher of the year 
plaque was presented to 
Mrs. Lola Pylant by Jeff 
Hamilton.

Sylvia Jane Hodges, Joyce 
Ellen Holmes, Monty Jack 
Hysinger, Jose Antonio I- 
barra, Pika La Chinn Kin- 
grev, Angelita Sylvia Ley­
va, Delilah Lopez, Rose-i 
mary C. Lopez, Jo Ann Sal­
dana Lopez, Trinidad Lopez 
Jr., Joe Martinez, Jose Al­
berto Martinez, Terry Lynn 
McCamisli, Peggy Sue 
Martin, Terrie LaDonna 
Mart'n, San Juana Martin-J 
ez, Kanda Kelly Mason,; 
Jeffrey Blaine Meeks, j 
RhonJa Kay Mills, Darrell 
Lynn Moore, Ramey Joe; 
Neel, Larry Norman, Rudy 
Orozco, Steve Orozco Jr.,j 
Kellie Kim Overman, Son- 
dra Lanice Parker, Denese 
Marie Peterson, Sherri Su­
zanne Pierce, Tammy Pier­
ce, Eugene M. Porras, 
Brian Wayne Powell, Kay 
Lynn Prather, Daniel Wil­
liam Puckett, Walter Way- | 
ne Precure, Sylvia Maria 
Quintana, Irma Ramos, 
Richard Kent Reynolds, 
Darla Lavon Rhodes Hunt, 
Kevin Jay Robin-on, Su­
sanna Sanchez Rodriguez, 
Lupe Rosales, Timothy 
Dwayne Sain, Frances Del­
gado Saldana. Amado Ral­
ph Sanchez, Maria de Je­
sus Mora Sanchez, Guiller- 
mina Mora Sanchez, Scot 
Lynn Saylor, Tommy Lynn 
Sexton, Janet Shain, Delia 
Jean Shaw, Devin Ray Si- 
semore, Jennifer Marie Til- 
Icroa. Cindy Gayle Turner, { 
Viki Jill Turner, Staci Lou­
ise Vandiver, George Vela, 
Curtis Dewayne Wheeler, 
Mary Jan Whitt, Marsha 
Elaine Williams, Paula Kay 
Williams, Terry Frank Wil­
liams, Johnny Anthony Y- 
barra, and Jennifer Louise 
Ziegenfuss.

WHO KNOWS?
1. Who wrote God Bless 
America?
2. What is the scientific 
term for basic living 
matter?
3. Name the state bird of 
Texas.
4. What is the electrical 
power of lightning flash?
5. How many years did 
the la.e J. Edgar Hoover 
serve as director of the 
FBI?
6. Under how many presi­
dents did he serve?
7. Who said, "A loving 
heart is the beginning of 
all knowledge” ?
8. To which art does 
pugilism refer?
9. Who was the 18th 
president?

Awwan T* VW K i m

1. Irving Berlin.
2. Protoplasm.
3. The Mockingbird.
4. An estimated equiva­
lent of 3,000 kilowat 
hours.
5. Forty-eight years.
6. Eight.
7. Thomas Carlyle.
8. The art of boxing.
9. Ulysses S. Grant

HultsTilt Stiff
E v e r^ c m

On Vour SeMestar Testa!
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Vacation Bible School June 7-11
The First United Meth­

odist Church in Muleshoe 
will be starting Vacation 
Bible School June 7-11. An 
all-new and exciting pro­
gram is being offered this 
summer for ages 3 through 
kids who will have finished 
the sixth grade this year. 
Classes will be from 9 to 
11:30 a.m. each weekday.

The theme for the school 
is Come, Follow Jesus. 
Lessons will be centered on 
the extraordinary power of 
Jesus as He taught His 
Apostles, transforming the 
lives of ordinary persons.

Bible-based lessons will 
be taught with excitement 
and variety through the use

of many advanced teaching 
methods. Students will be 
challenged and involved 
through activities such as 
songtime, Bible-study, in­
teresting visual demonstra­
tions, craft - making and 
many others.

At the assembly every­
day there will be a special 
guest - the Lollipop Dra­
gon. He will be teaching 
the children special les­
sons.

For information regard­
ing attending, call Carol 
Cox at 272-4396 or Suesy 
Barron at 272-5334.

Come and bring your 
friends and neighbors. And 
we’ll see you at Vacation

Bible School June 7-11.

Oyster crop looks 
promising for second 
consecutive year

GALVESTON — If Mother 
Nature continues to regulate 
rainfall as she has so far this 
year, fishermen along the Cull 
Coast can expect another good 
crop of oysters, says a marine 
biologist at Texas A&M Uni­
versity at Galveston.

‘‘If weather and water condi- 
tions keep up the way they 
have, we may very well have 
another good year. Or. Sam- 
my Kay said recently. The oys­
ter harvest off the Texas coast 
was a record this year in terms 
of fattening, spawning and set­
ting. “So far, the rains have 
been gizod for oysters — now if 
they would just hold off until 
mid-summer.' he said.

AfULESHOE JUNIOR HIGH SCHOOL TRACK TEAM PLACES EIRST IN DISTRICT 
IlRACK MEET -Pictured from left to right are members of the Junior High Track team, 
first row: L-r: Curtis Snell, Brandon Cox; second row, Adrian Perez, Kevin Manasco, Loy 
Ifiana, Wes Hanks, Coach Ronnie Jones; third row, Steve Griswold, Brett King, Isrcal 
iijfante, Scott Calvert, David Navejar, Michael Precure; fourth row. Jay Hawkins,Jose 
Sanchez, Ben Allison, Sean Shipman, Sergio Leal; fifth row, Ricky Rasco, Jarrod Embry, 
Sammy Wilson, Jaime Torrez, Donney Burris; sixth row, Rudy Pena. Lester Burks, Ronnie 
Lpgsdon. Rickv Flowers and David Vela.

Forfeited Vets ’ Land 
Sales Planned June8

Land Commissioner Bob 
Armstrong has announced 
that the Texas Veterans 
Land Board will hold a 
sealed-bid of of, forfeited 
veterans tracts on June 8. 
Minimum bids will be re­
quired.

The land parcels arc all 
10 or more acres and are 
located in 49 different 
counties. Only veterans 
will be allowed to bid on 
84 of ilie tracts and the 
board will finance 95 per­
cent of the successful bid­
ding price at seven per 
cent interest for 40 years.

The other 12 tracts will be 
available to veterans at 
'the seven percent rate 
and to non-veterans at 
eight and one-half percent 
interest for 40 years.

Armstrong, who sits as 
chairman of the board, 
said this was the first for­
feited land sale the board 
has held in almost fixe 
years.

"Considering that we 
have almost 43.(XX) tracts 
under contract at any giv­
en lime, 1 am quite im­
pressed with how few 
tracts have been forfeited

and I think we can all be 
extremely proud of the re­
sponsibility with which 
our Texas veterans have 
managed their land pro­
gram loans," Armstrong 
said.

Details of how to bid on 
the tracts and where they 
are located may be obtain­
ed by writing to Arm- 
stong in care of the Vet­
erans Land Board, I (X) 
North Congress Avenue. 
Austin, Texas 78701.

GRADUATING PARTY-Tnnc Gutierrez Bouley, daugh­
ter of Mrs. Maria Gutierrez of Muleshoe, was honored 
with a graduating party at the Bouley residence in 
Amarillo following commencement exercises. May 15, in 
Canyon. She is a 1973 graduate of Muleshoe High 
School and graduated from West Texas State University 
and received a bachelor degree. The party was hosted 
by Fran G. Miramontcs and Lupe Mendoza.

TEEX rescue course 
booked into 1984

COLLEGE STATION — In­
dustrial accidents can happen 
at even the safi-st plants, and 
rescue teams mas only get one 
chance to do their job right in a 
life-or-dcath situation.

That’s whs more companies 
are sending employees to the 
Texas Engineering Extension 
Service's week-long industrial 
rescue course to receive train­
ing in first-aid and removing 
unconscious victims from 
buildings and steel tanks.

Classes are taught at Bray- 
ton Fireman Training Field, a 
60-acre facility located south­
west of the main Texas A&M 
University campus.

The rescue course, taught 
more than a dozen times a 
year, is already scheduled into 
19X4, said John llubacek, a 
rescue training specialist.
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Complete & Balanced 
Nutrition Dog Food 

PUPPY FOOD „
27% PROTEIN

20 LB. Bog ^ 5 ^

HI-PROTEIN 
DOG MEAL 50 IB. Bog
26%  PROTEIN

$105

Ellis Funeral Home
Pre-Planned‘Funeral Needs
272-4574 Muleshoe

Kills weeds 
& grasses in:
• Flower Beds
• Lawns
• Around Trees
• Shrub Beds

ferti-lom e
Baker

Farm Supply
1532 W . 

A m e ric a n  B lv d . 
272-4613

Five Point

‘ Dog Food
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50 LB. Bog
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25 LB. Bag

$ J 1 5
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RED RAIDER DAY
In Muleshoe

Thursday, May 27 At The Muleshoe Country Club
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Golf Tournament Schedule:

S i g n  I n . . . . l : 3 0  p . m .
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Shotgun Start....2 p.m.

Refreshment Hour....6 p.m.
Dinner.... 7 p.m.

The Coaching Staff Of Texas Tech Will Be In Attendance
Presented In The Public Interest By:

Muleshoe State Bank 
First National Bank 

Muleshoe Publishing Co.
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MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Arnold Ben Madrid, Am­

arillo and Antelina Leyva. 
Muleshoe.

Enrique Ogas, Jr., Grand 
Forks, N.D. and Nora Del- 
va Rojas, Muleshoe.

WARRANTY DEEDS
Robert A. Wallace 11 and 

wife, Andrea Kay Wallace 
to Antonio Luna and wife. 
Carmen -  All of Lot Num­
ber (1), in Block Number 
(2), Hillcrest Addition 
Number (2), to the Town of 
Muleshoe, Bailey County, 
Texas.

Joel David Snider and 
wife, Carol Snider to Peggy 
Snider -- A Tract of Land 
out of Section 79. Block Z,

r

m
SEVENTH GRADE TRACKSTERS AT MULESHOE JUNIOti ///Ctf-Pictureo are the 
membefe of the Seventh Grade Track team of Muleshoe Junior High. Left to right: front 
row, Lance King, Paul Chamberlin, Todd Bessire, Michael Angeley, Norman Perez, Kenny 
Whitecotton; second row, David Medlin, Rudy Gonzales, Rammie Gamer, Charles Matin, 
Mike Robledo, Coach Ross Dodson; third row, Jesse Garcia, Ramon Martinez. Martin 
Robledo, Scott Bickel, Freddy Paez; fourth row, Sidney Lewis, Demetrio Guillen, Mark 
Matil, Roy Ramos, Michael Neel, Chris Harris; fifth row, Francisco Ybarra, Nathan Lloyd, 
Scott Williams, Richard Hernandez, Brent Black and Roger Pena: first in district.

Dr. Harper 
Memorial Rites 
Held

Memorial services for Dr. 
Pies Harper, 78, were held 
Tuesday at 4:30 p.m. at the 
First Presbyterian Church 
in Canyon with Dr. Baldwin 
Stribling officiating undet 
the direction of Schooler - 
Gordon Funeral Home.

A longtime resident of 
Canyon, Dr. Harper was 
bom March 4, 1904 in Car- 
son County, Texas. He was 
the brother of Mrs. John 
Milam and J. B. Harper, 
both of Sudan.

He died Sunday at his 
home.,in Canyon. _

Dlt' Harper was -bead of

the Modem Language de­
partment at WTSU from 
1946 until retirement in 
1970. He was a member of 
the board for the Canyon 
Chamber of Commerce, he 
had served for five years in 
diplomatic service in Peru. 
He earned that nation's 
highest honor, Orden de 
Sol, for distinguished con­
tributions to the improve­
ment of Peruvian - North 
American understanding.

He is credited for devel­
opment of the charter busi­
ness for Trailways Bus 
Company. As a Rotarian, 
he was a delegate to the 
International Convention in 
Australia; served on a com­
mittee for the Heart Asso­
ciation; Cancer Association; 

'Boy^Sfcoltts

Association. In addition, lie 
was helpful in many church 
and other civic activities.

Other survivors include 
his wife, Margaret Harper 
of Canyon, a son, John of 
Custer County, Colorado; a 
daughter, Mrs. Harry Sny­
der of Taos, N. M., ano­
ther sister, Mrs. Allie Will- 
shire of Amarillo; and a 
brother, Melton Harper of 
HI Paso and one grandson, 
Jason Paul Harper of Colo­
rado.

Golden Gleams
Man is distinguished from 

all other creatures by 
the faculty of laughter.

•Joseph Addison.

Who is more busy than he 
— *.— ■ that hath least to do?

-John Clarke.

HURDT'S
QUALITY COTTONS

Box 16343 Lubbock , Texas 79490 
(806) 792-0653 885-2260

STRENGTH X YIELD=PR0FIT
AND THAT MEANS HURDT'S 580

BEAT THE DEPRESSION PRICES W ITH HURDT'S 580. IF YOU ARE TIRED 
OF MEDIOCRE C O T TO N ...........PLANT THE PREMIER COTTON OF THE WORLD

580 CHARACTERISTICS:
85,0C0 PSI or ta tte r  Pressley (25 or better grams per tex). 1 1/32 inch staple 
or better. Resistant to Fusarium, Verticillium wih & Root Knot nematode. High 
yields of 1 to  3 bales per acre. Strips clean. (Texas & Oklahoma) MICR0NAIRE 
3.5 to  4.0. Picks clean (Deep South & Arizona). Dry land or irrigated. Gins good.
COTTON MILLS WOULD PREFER TO SPIN IT BECAUSE OF 25 or BETTER GRAMS PER TEX 
Mokes excellent blue jeans & cotton fcbrics.

11m  Bottom Une.. It Pots More Money In Your Pockets I
*

Fanner
Hurdt's

_

K i m n i A Prunner
Plant Hurdt's Certified 580, That's Hurdt's Texas Certified 580

WD and FW Johnson Sub­
division, Bailey County, 
Texas.

Billy Jim St. G air and 
wife, Tommie Marlene St. 
Clair to Billy Tom St. Clair 
-- All of Lot (10), Blcok (5). 
Country Club Addition to 
Bailey County, Tdias. 

Thomas R. White and

Misdemeanor Probation. 
DISTRICT COURT 

Muleshoe Independent 
School vs Vernon Puckett - 
Motion to Dismiss.

Vickie Lynn Bomcr and 
Michael Don Bomer - DV.

WHO KNOWS?

»• • • • • • • « i h m i m m u m m i m i m *

West Plain* 1
l Medical Center { 
| Report |

ADMITTED

May 17 - Maria Acosta, 
Veronica Soto, Joe Lee 
Truelock, Orlando Arredon- 
da.

May 18 - Laurose Page, 
Maria A. Alfaro, Commie 
Blain, Maggie Daniel).

May 19 - Maria Gutier­
rez, Jonesa Jennings, Fred­
die Chavez, Willie Wolfe, 
Angie Marquez, Dosha Dy­
kes.

May 20 - Judy Logsdon. 
Brenda Johnson, Lupe Bra- 
iliff, Jakie Humphrey.

DISMISSED

May 17 - Jack Hysinger, 
Bertha Beene, Acie Kelton.

May 18 - Jerry Robinson, 
Oscar Bartley, Elvira Loya 
and baby boy, Kenneth 
Ruiz, Joe Gutierrez.

May 19 - Sherri Wilkin­
son, Joe Lee Truelock, L.
V. Hall, Maria Alfara and 
baby boy, Janie Moraw, S.
W. Moore.

May 20 - W. C. McMa­
han, Orlando Arredondo, 
Freddie Chavez, Maggie 
Danieil, Salamon Rodri­
guez. Juanita Anaya and 
baby.

wife. Cynthia E. WHite to 1 How,  many Presidents 
Diamond Shamrock Corp.. . “ me fr° m the state of 
a Delaware Corporation -- Virginia.'
All of Lot Number (3). Park 2l Namc ,hem'
Ridge Addition, First In­
stallment to the Town of 
Muleshoe, Bailey County,
Texas.

Miguel Navejar and wife,
Minnie Navejar to Alfredo 
Noe Anzaldua -- All of Lot 
Number (35), Block Num­
ber (10), Lenau Subdivision 
to the Town of Muleshoe,
Bailey County, Texas.

James D. Merritt spa J.
D. Medrritt to Marla Van- 
nett Merritt Field -- All of 
Lot Number (10), Block 
Number (9). Lenau Subdivi­
sion to the City of Mule­
shoe, Bailey County, Texas.

COUNTY COURT

Larry Clyde Winkler,
Speeding. $35 fine.

Ray Donald Wills, Speed­
ing, $35 fine.

Luis Ray Solano - Order 
Discharging defendant from 
Misdemeanor Probation.

Austin Herman - Order 
Discharging defendant from 
Misdemeanor Probation.

Bernardo Herrera - Order 
Dismissing defendant from 
Misdemeanor Probat:on.

Brady L. Stroup - Order 
dismissing defendant from

3. Who was the 27th 
president?
4. What are the four 
kinds of teeth?
5. How many states en­
tered the Union during 
the month of June?
6. Name them.
7. On what day in May 
did Lindbergh make his 
nonstop flight to Paris?
8. What was the name of 
his plane?
9. How many drops are in 
a teaspoon?
10. Who composed the 
operetta. "Babes in Toy- 
land?”
Anwar* T* W li b m

1. Eight.
2. W ashington, Jeffer­
son, Madison, Monroe, 
Harrison, Tyler, Taylor 
and Wilson.
3. William Howard Taft.
4. Incisor, cuspid, bicus­
pid and molar.
5. Six.
6. New Hampshire, Vir­
ginia, Kentucky, Tenes- 
see, Arkansas and West 
Virginia.
7. May 20. 1927.
8. “ The Spirit of St. 
Louis.”
9. From 40 to 50 drops. 
1C.Victor Herbert.

Lazbuddie
School 
Menu

MONDAY 
Breakfast 
Peanut Butter 
Jelly Toast 
Juice 
Milk 
Lunch
Burritos/hot sauce 
Buttered Corn 
Green Salad 
Cake 
Milk

TUESDA Y 
Breakfast 
Cereal 
Juice 
Milk 
Lunch
Hamburgers 
French Fries 
Pickles, Onion. Lettuce 
Fruit 
Milk

WEDNESDA Y 
Breakfast 
Toast Jelly 
Juice 
Milk

Lunch
Meal & Cheese Tacos/hot 
sauce
Pinto Beans 
Green Salad 
Fruit 
Milk

THURSDAY 
Breakfast 
Cereal 
Juice 
Milk 
Lunch
Juicy Burger 
French Fries 
Pickhs
Ice Cream Cups 
Milk

FRIDAY
SCHOOL IS OUT 

ONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ

1. Who won the Houston 
Open golf tournament?
2. Who won the LPGA Suf­
folk Gassic?
3. Dan Driessen plays pro 
baseball for what team?
3. How many tim es has 
Kareem Abdul-Jabbar won 
NBA’s most valuable player?

Answers To Sport Qsfa
1. Ed Sneed.
2. Sally Little.
3. Cincinnati Reds.
4. Six times.

Sales & Service For

M A H A G
For 14 Yean  And Wtfl Continue 

To Be!
\7\Com e In Today & Let “Smiling 

Gdrdon Make You A Deal!

LAWN
i f i m

PLUS
DIA2 IN0 N '

Feed your 
lawn and 
control 
chinch bugs, 
grubworms, 
chiggers 
and ticks 
in one easy 
application.

A time saver!
Dtazinon* trademark of CtBA-GEIGY

fertHome
Baker Farm Supply

1532 W . Am er. B lvd . 

272-4613

The Annual
Stockholders Meeting

O f

The Muleshoe Co-op Gins
Will Be

Monday May 24, 1982
8 p.m. H

Muleshoe High School Cafeteria

A Dinner Of Chicken Bits & Fish 
Will Be Served, Followed By A Business 

Meeting & Election Of New Directors.

i • • •

You hove heard a ll th e  good things about HURDT'S COTTON, how ever w e fee l 
i t  is our du ty  to  te ll you th e  only bad point in planting our v a rie ty , you are  
surely going to  put yourself in a  higher TAX BRACKET.

Cetten Hatting Seed At Yew Gie Or Hurdt's Dealer Or Cal:

HURDT'S
I

Board Members:
James Brown, President

David Stovally 
Bobby Redwine, Secretary 

Charles Moraw, Manager

Vice President

Directors: 
Curby Brantley 
Doyce Turner 
James Warren 
Steven Bell

Dividend Checks To The Amount Of 
Over $35 $345,000 Will Be Distributed..

See You There!
* A

-r*
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I Nursing Home
'  ^

News
By:

Joy Stancell

k

Thursday morning, Jam ­
es Williams and members 
of the Nazarene Church 
came to have a devotional 
with the residents.

Thursday afternoon, C. 
W. Wilhite, Retta Shipp, 
Maud Kersey and Mr. Em­
bry came to play dominces 
and 42 with the residents.

* * * * *

Friday morning. Ora Ro­
berts, Louise Sullivan, Al­
ma Henley, Rosemary Pool, 
Effte Smith, and Margaret 
Beard made butterflies to 
decorate the Nursing Home 
in crafts.

*****
Friday afternoon was our 

Play Day. We had relays 
and games. We thank all of 
our residents for participat­
ing.

*****

PERSONALS

Sunday morning, c B. 
Wilson came to have Bible
study with the residents. 

*****
The Methodist Church 

came to sing to the resi­
dents Sunday afternoon. 

*****
Tuesday afternoon, the 

Hospital and Nursing Home 
auxiliary came to work in 
their Beauty Shop. They 
shampooed and set about 
25 ladies hair, gave some 
hair cuts and manicures. 
They really make our ladies 
look lovely.

*****
Alva Shofner’s sister and 

brother in law from Brown- 
wood visited her Wednes­
day.

*****
On Wednesday morning, 

Monica Reynolds, Marilyn 
Riley, Dani Heathington all 
from Alpha Zeta Pi, gave a 
Bingo Party for the resi­
dents. Prizes were given to 
those who bingoed and to 
everyone who participated. 
Refreshments of punch and

PERSONALS
• A c t ,

I

Q W  OF THANKS
tould Like, xto exp/te^ss oua 

thanks to eveny one who showed 
c o n c e A n  fa n  Ted d w t in y  k i d  n e c e n t  

h ospita l sta y .
fay (pd bless each, and eveny 

one o (  you.

Ted and Holly foil loop

Spudnuts were served. 
*****

Sunday May 30th, 2-4:00 
p.m., the Nursing Home 
invites you to our open 
house. We are looking for-

PUBLIC NOTICE
The Trustees of the 

Muleshoe Independent Sch­
ool District will offer for 
sale by sealed bids the fol- 
lowing equipment:

1 • 1963 Dodge, 6 cyl, 
automatic, van

1 - 1967 GMC 2 Ton 
Van

3 - Electric Hotpoint 
Pressure Cookers, 220 Volt 

1 - Metal Cutter 
1 - Language Laboratory 

Console with 25 booths and 
headphones

All of the above items 
are in fair to good condi­
tion and may be inspected 
by appointment. Call Tom 
Jinks, Assistant Superinten­
dent, at 272-3911 for ap­
pointment.

Bids will be opened on 
Monday, June 14, 982, at 
8:00 p.m. The Board re­
served the right to reject 
any and all bids in the best 
interest of the District, 
pub. not.-21s-7tc

ward to you being in our 
home. We hope you can
come.

*****

Bertie Hendrix was visit­
ed by Lcanri, Sherry. Hil­
bert and Audrey.

*****

Tele/ Auction '82
Mo y  24-29

MIKNICH IS  6  30  p m  SAT  '  3 0  f  m

C O UK TM US
____THE fllueflQOflT CRUISE O f VOUR tlf€TIM e

— BflBV LLV C f«  SCATS----------
CAMPING fl CAR____

CAMERA EQUIPMENT______ C6 FOOD _
JCUJtUtV Ffltt STANDING AMPUKC5

RADIOS raCVISION DISC Pi AYER___
FURNITURE FISHING AND HUNTING PACHAGCS

_U.IATCH€S______ UJATERBEDS—
___COCOA TELEVISION— .

PEANUTS FROM THE PORTRLES VALIEV.

Vocation packers

t e l e v is e c Ta r t  p r e v ie w
SUNDAY- «•< !3 Ze«t

UJhere the action is

.

IIAHim iKF | BARGAIN I  TOOL VALUE
VALUE I  0f t h e  m o n t h  I  OF THE MONTH

O I ! l l l ) I O \ T I I  M  / ■  ’

e /rv F jF /,7/ / ,  a -

ONE-STEP 
POLY SEALANT
Enough to clean, shine and 
teal 2 cars. Protects by 
bonding to metallic sur­
face. Lasts 2 years or 
money back from Blue 
Coral*. 16 oi.

Quantities Limited

For Mothers' Day
F I S K A R S  
2-PIECE 
SCISSORS SET

Scissers,

59 9 S u pptt*

L is t

2 pairs of incredibly light­
weight, permanently-sharp­
ened sc issors at one low 
price. Contoured plastic 
handles add extra cutting 
comfort. 9451/91

QUANTISES LHhUTtD

t o u t  I t  U P l  ft.

FLORAL 
TOOLS

Your Choice!

now
fast

Each tool features a steel 
blade and Fire-Hardened* 
ash handle that resists 
weather and wear. GC40/3/2
A) Hoe. Tubular ferrule.
B) Cultivator. Tubular ferrule.
C) Shovel. With turned step. 

^^^^lUAkrnTTF^uiiirrED^

Fry & Cox, Inc.
101 S. Main 272-4511

CAM) OF THANKS
To o u a  many faiends who ex- 

psessed th eix  love ho o u a  fam­
i l y  duxing the lo ss o a  o u a  moi- 
heAf L ottie  faoxe. Foa youA 
pxayexs, JUowexs, faod and memox- 
h alt, fay (pd 's b lessin gs be with.

mck ° l  t”"’ The
(d  faoxe, 
fable Keiyal,
£ ls ie  Damson, 
(hexnie U/illaxd, 
Jessie  Ul/seman 

Wishes ho say Thank %u•

C m  of T im s

I t Le hand to fand uoxds to 
expxess my thanks fa a the condo, 
ca lls, pxayexs, and v is its  u tile  
l  was in the h ospital•

Oua do d o  as and nuxses one 
the bent*

ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

Thanks Again, 
J a n ie  fa  a m

MULESHOE ASSEMBLY OF GOD
517 5outh First
Rev. James Golaz
EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Emmaneul
107 East Third
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor
RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST CHURCH
17th and West Ave. D

•*

Brock Sanders, Pastor 
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
East Third and Ave. E 
Rev. Roy Martinez 
TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
314 Avq. B 
Don Knight, Pastor 
LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH 
Phone 946-3413 
B.C. Stoneciphcr, Pastor 
SIXTEENTH AND AVE. D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 
James Johnson, Pastor 
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Donald G. Proctor 
Progress, Texas
NORTH SIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
117 E. Birch Street 
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
East 6th and Ave. F 
Rev. David Lou
UNITED PENTECOSTAL GOSPEL
LIGHTHOUSE CHURCH
207 E. Ave. G
Oeorge Green, Pastor
MULESHOE BAPTIST CHURCH
8th Street and Ave. G
Bob Dodd, Pastor
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave. E
Rev. J.E. Meeks

m m m m
J h e  open door of this church is a fitting 

symbol for the heart of God, for His heart is 
open always to all men. The Bible records 
these words, "Behold, 1 have set before you 
an open door which no one is able to shut.” 
Yes, literally no one can put any kind of 
block between God and us. His love sur­

mounts every obstacle. That door is open for 

you today and every day.

NEW CONVENANT CHURCH 
Plainview Highway 
Jimmy Low, Pastor 
Sunday, 10 a.m.
Wednesday: 7:00 p.m.

'•On o f  H

n o  o . / .  , ,b °N f a  * * * •

TEMPLO CALVARIO 
507 South Main 

Rev. J. L. Soto, Pastor 
Sunday 10: a.m. 
Sunday, 7 p.m. 

Evangelistic Services

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Ninth and Ave. C 
Rev. Jimmie Williams, Pastor 
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
130 W. Ave. G 
Rev. Dick Tarr 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11; 00 a.m.
LATIN AMERICAN METHODIST MISSION \ 
Ave. D and Fifth Street 
R.Q. Cahvez, Pastor 
THE COMMUNITY CHURCH 
Morton Highway 
H.D. Hunter, Pastor 
CAL VARY BAPTIST CHURCH 
James Williams, Pastor 
1733 W. Ave. C
PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH 
Clifford Slay, Pastor 
1st and 3rd Sundays
FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
Rev. Bill Kent 
507 West 2nd, Muleshoe 
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN 
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter, Pastor 
Sunday School - 10 a.m. 
worship Service - 11a.m.

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH 
621 South First 
Elder Bernard Gowens 
MULESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST 
David Cox, Minister 
Clovis Highway 
JEHOVAH WITNESS 
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Minister 
.MMACUALTE CONCEPTION CATHOLIC 
Father Patrick Mahar 
Northeast of City in Morrison Edition 
ST. MATTHEW BAPTIST CHURCHS 
Corner of West Boston and West Birch 
Rev. M.S. Brown, Pastor

3

£

5

.  . . ; V

VISA

West Plains 
Pharmacy

708 S. 1st. 272-4524

Robert Green Inc.
You r O ldsm obile, GMC, 

Pontiac, Buick Dealer 
W . H w y. 84 ..V, 272-4588

Farmers Sprayingj 
Service

Muleshoe Co-op 
Gins

301 N. First •  272-3420
I v C i H f l  f l  i R

Manager: John Robinson

TT y yDent-Rempe 
Implement Co

John Deere Dealer

temp’s Discount 
Furniture

1210 W . Am er. B lvd. 
272-5023

< D a iri{  
Q u e e n

M argie H awkins 
^  M anager

272-3412

White’s Cashway 
Grocery

W here Friends M eet 
id  P rices T i

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave, B_______ 272-4288

American Valley
o

114 Main

Main Street 
Beauty Salon

272-3448

401 S. 1st 

272-4511

A tte n d  T h e  C h u rc h  O f  

Y o u r C h o ic e

Drug I Muleshoe Body
Shop

402 N , F irst
i

BAILEY COUNTY JOURNAL 
MULESHOE TEXAS



DEADLINE
FOR

CLASSIFIED 
ADS IS 

TUESDAYS 
AND FRIDAYS 

11:00 A M .

V I M a l i i l l  lilfeM iiiiV  jJ P

PUBLIC NOTICE
The Muleshoe Indepen­

dent School District is ac­
cepting bids for construc­
tion of a public restroom 
near the football field, 
and renovation of a class­
room ■ partitioned into of- 
fice/space.

Sealed bids will be re­
ceived no later than 8:00 
,p.m. Monday, June 14, 
1982. Question*: concern­
ing the above to be di­
rected to Tom Jinks (806) 
272-3911, School Business 
Office. 514 West Avenue 
G, Muleshoe, Texas 79- 
347.

Bids will be opened 
during the Regular Meet- 

. ing on June 14, 1982 at 
8:00 p.m. at the School 
Business Office. The 
Board reserves the right 
to reject any and all bids 
and to accept the bid 
which appears to be in 
the best interest of the 
District.
20s-6lc

LEGAL NOTICE 
CITATION 

BY
PUBLICATION 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
TO: feUa Rubio Garcia 
Moreno Los Angeles, Po- 
anas. Durango, Mexico, 
Respondent;

GREETINGS:
YOU ARE HEREBY 

COMMANDED to appear 
and answer before the 
Honorable 287th Judicial 
District Court, Bailey 
County, Texas, at the 
Courthouse of said County 
in Mu!e$)ioe, Texas, at or 
before 10 o’clock a.m. of 
the Monday next after the 
expiration of 20 days from 
the date of service of this 
citation, then and there to 
answer the petition of Ped­
ro Morjno, Petitioner, filed 
in said Court on the 19th 
day of May, 1982, against 
Elsa Rubio Garcia Moreno, 
Respondent, and said suit 
being numbered 4803 on 
the docket of said Court, 
and entitled "In The Mat­
ter of Marriage of Pedro 
Moreno and Elsa Rubio 
Garcia Moreno,” the na­
ture of which suit is a re­
quest to Divorce.

The Court has authority 
in this suit to enter any 
judgment or decree dissol­
ving the marriage and pro­
viding for the division of 
property which will be 
binding on you.

The Court has authority 
in this suit to enter any 
judgment or decree in the 
child’s interest, which will 
be binding upon you, in- 
cludng the termination of 
the parent-child re'.ati >n- 
shij), the determination of 
paternity and the appoint­
ment of a conservator with 

, authority to consent to the 
child's adoption.

If this citation is not 
served within ninety days 
after the date of its issuan­
ce, it shad be returned, 
unserved.

The officer executing this 
writ shall promptly setve 
the same according to re­
quirements of law, and the 
mand^cs hereof, and make 
due return as the law di­
rects"1.

Issued and given under 
my hand and the seal of 
said Court at Muleshoe, 
'fckas. this the 19th day of 
May, 1982.

Nelda Merriott Clerk 
District Court 
Bailey County, Texas 

pub. not.-21s-ltc

* * ♦ * ___
Never be afraid of 

what others say if you’re 
sure that you approve of 
what you've done.

* * * * 160-acre farm for sale. 4
An idea is one fhmg; miles north on „  2yA

putting it into words so
that everyone will under- ta / /  272'42flu-
stand it is another. 8-6s-tsc

* * * *
*........................................... . FOR SALE: 3-BR brick

PERSONALS Ihouse, 1-V« baths, living
....... ................. , ............ .. room, den with fireplace,
..............................................  ‘large storage in back. 1713

WE BUY USED f t '  Ave- H- Cal1 272 3400
FURNITURE AND after 5 and on weekends'

APPLIANCES • 8-3s-stfc

CALL 272-3030 By OWNER: 3 BR, 2 bath'
HARWl Y BASS assumable 10% loanl902

APPLIANCE W. Ave. E. Call 272-5289.
l-18s-tfc 8-20s-tfc

I will not be responsible 
for any debts other than 
my own, made by me. 
Chris Broyles.
1-19t-8tc

FREE complimentary fac­
ial. Mary Kay Cosmetics. 
Yohnda Bell. Beauty Con­
sultant. 925-6664. 
l-8s-tfc
•......................... -................

REGISTERED FAMILY 
home has opening for 
child care. Reduced rates 
due to location. Call 965- 
■2779.
1-18s-tfc

, INSTANT CREDIT 
Living room group or 
Bedroom set. $699.95. 
$75.00 down, $60 per 
month. Baker Furniture, 
108 E. Ave. B. 272-4000. 
We tote the note. 
l-16t-tfc

SARATOGA GARDENS 
1300 N. Walnut - Friona 

Phone 247-3666 
NOW, 1 MONTH FREE 
RENT 1,2, or 3 bedroom 
apartments, modern, wall 
to wall carpet, heating/ 
cooling, kitchen equipped, 
laundry facilities, parking. 
Low rent for needy fami* 
lies. Call collect.

MADAME ROSE 
PALM READER 
AND ADVISOR 

Tells past, present and 
future. Having problems 
in love, marriage, busi­
ness, health, happiness, 
finance? Cannot save 
money, hard time to suc­
ceed? Advised on all 
matters of life. There is 
no problem so great she 
cannot solve. Open 7 
days a week, 8a.m.-10 
p.m. No appointment ne­
cessary. Speaks English 
and Spanish.
219 E. 9th. Littlefield.
385-5452.
l-20t-8tc

WANTED: Experienced
beautician. Apply in per­
son at Main St. Beauty 
Salon.
3-8stfc
........... ...............................

SELL THE BEST 
We’re the world's largest 
direct - selling company. 
We’re Avon.

Call Now:
Phyllis Duff 

806-794-3498 or 
Nettie Long - 272-3208 

3-18s-9tc

NEED TO HIRE a nursery 
worker for services on 
Sundays. Richland Hills 
Baptist Church. Call 
272-J5229 or 272-5414. 

f 3-19t-ifc

IRRIGATED new under­
ground pipe. 2-158 acre 
tracts near Muleshoe. $650 
acre. Norman Realtors, 
806-795-9514.
8-15s-tfc

STATE SALE SETTLE­
MENT/ New Mexico. Kil- 
lion Farms. 2800 acres/cul- 
tivation including modern 
home. Cash or price nego­
tiable. Also large modern 
home "Built 1974” on ad­
jacent 2 to 10 acres. By 
owner trustee; Will be in 
New Mexico May 21-28 at 
505-356-4098. After that, 
contact Joe Fr azier, 109 
Longhorn, Tx. 76240 or 
Call 817-668-6334.
8-21s-8tc

2 BR house, 2 bath. 
Stucco, 100 ft. lot. Ideal 
for apartment housing. 
Egtateji_  oear _gtade 
school and downtown.

316 acres, 18 miles north 
of Muleshoe in Parmer 
County. 2-pivot systems, 
2 irrigation wells. Estab­
lished alfalfa hay. Low 
down payment. Good 
terms.

Country living 3 bedroom, 
2 bath, double garage, 
brick home on Hwy 2 miles 
from tov.n. Immediate po- 
session.
8-46t-8-46t-tfc

Small acreage 3 miles 
east o f Muleshoe on 
highway.

For Sale or Trade
320 acre farm 5-irriga- 
tion wells, underground 
pipe, 2-pivot sprinkler 
systems, 2 houses, all 
metal barn, Lamb Coun­
ty, good terms.

I l l  W. Avenue B. 
Muleshoe 
272-4581 
8-44s-tfc

JlMMlt CR/ WFQRt
M M  IS TM I i. IN ttP A N fl

320 acres N.E. town with 
3 wells.

40 acres east of town 
with 8”  well.

1.97 acres with 2 bed­
room trailer house and 
barn.

3 bedroom house with 
fireplace and cellar.

3 bedroom house in Le- 
nau Addition.

Metal office building 
with 4 offices, lobby and 
large work area.

59 x 140’ lot by Park. 

8-21 s-stfc

Choice Building site. Rich­
land Hills. Will finance. 
272-4096 
ll-49s-stfc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 BR, 
1 y*, LR, kitchen-dining 
combination, den, ample 
storage, corner lot, near 3 
schools, 1928 sq. ft. living 
area, 621 West 6th. Phone 
272-4732 days or 272-4827 
evenings.
8-2s-tfc

Several good used lake 
pumps. Floating pumps 
and slant pumps. KMP 
Pumps. 257-3411 
15-lis-tsc

DENT & ASSOCIATES 
REAL -E STA TE

FARMS-RANCHES
COMMERCIAL
RESIDENTIAL

LEON DENT, broker 
nites 272-3580

DON REMPE 
nites 272-4643

1516 W. AMERICAN 
MULESHOE, TX. 793*7 

OFFICE 272-4296

LIST YOUR 
PROPERTY WITH US

8-6t-tfc

Smallwood Real Estate 
232 Main 
272-4838 

*****

3 Bedroom brick, 2 bath, 
dishwasher, central 
heat, refrigerated air, 
one car garage & fenced 
backyard. Richland Hills

2 Apartments, 2 bed­
room, w/bath each, new 
carpet and paint. Small 
down payment, owner 
financing.

3 BR, w/bath, brick, 
large living room, fen­
ced backyard and stor­
age building.

2 BR stucco, sihall down 
payment. Owner will fi­
nance.

See or call Joe Small­
wood, Broker.

REID REAL ESTATEv 
we want your business 

"Remefnber 
REID REAL ESTATE 

1614 W. American Blvd. 
272-3142

Nice 2 BR. 1 baih fen­
ced back yard, storage 
building. Loan can be 
assumed, nice locatioif. 
See to believe.

2,2 mobile home on 2 
lots. Pay equity and 
take up low payments.

Do your own landscap­
ing on this. 3, l-3/«,2. 
Nice location.

4,2,1. Cyclone fence in 
back. Close to school.

Nice 3,1,1 fireplace, ca­
thedral ceilings, carpet 
and paint 1 yr. old, fen­
ced, has storm windows 
and doors. Priced to 
sell.

3,2,1 pacesetter storm 
windows and door, fen­
ced backyard, standing 
fireplace. Good location, 
assumable loan.

Large brick building or. 
corner lot. Priced to sell

FARMS
3 labors of dry land.

80 acres with well. 
Close to town.

40 acres with well close 
to town.

See us for 
additional listings. 

Thursie Reid 
8-10s-tfc

MULCIHOI TCI A t

R E A L  E S T A T E
RANCHEa HOMEt

John W .  Smi t h
2 7 2 - 4 6 7 8
2 7 2 - 5 3 3 5

Stucco house painted in-'  
side and out. 3 bed­
rooms. 2 baths. All new 
carpet.

Nice brick home in Rich­
land Hills. 3 Bedrooms, 
2 Bathrooms. Living 
Room, Den w/fireplace, 
and Office.

Large brick house with 
over 2300 sq. ft. living 
area. 3 BR, 2-bath and 
2-car garage. Priced at 
$65,000. Has an assum­
able loan of $21,900 at 
7%%.

Nice 2 bedroon, house. 
Central heat, refrigerat­
ed air, washer, dryer 
and microwave oven. 
Located at 1829 W. 
Ave. B. $27,500.00

Small 2 bedroom house, 
all oanellcd and carpet­
ed. $23,500. Located at 
303 W. 7th.

Nice 3 bedroom, 7 bath 
brick home with fire­
place. Has 2 car garage, 
covered patio, storm cel­
lar and back yard fence.

This house priced for 
quick sale. Almost 2000 
sq. ft of living space. 4 
BR, 2 baths, refrigerat­
ed air and central heat.

816s-tfc
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Do You Want To 
Buy A New Home?

i  If you qualify we now have I  
* 100% financing with closing * 
|  cost not included. I

Gall Today! |
Thursie Reid 

1 stfc 272-3142

Krebbs Real Estate 
201 W. Ave. C 

Appraisals

Serving Muleshoe Area 35 
years. We Appreciate your 
business.
8-52t-tfc

BINGHAM & NIEMAN 
REALTY 

116 E. Ave. C
272-5285 965-2488

4-3'/i-2 brick, approx. 
3600 sq. ft. of lv. area, 
2 fireplaces, dry sauna, 
basement, and many 
other extras, Richland 
Hills.

Lcnau Add.-3-l'/i-2 car 
carport. Cent. A&H, 
Franklin fireplace, 20x- 
20 shop, a nice home, 
and priced to sell.

31+1 car detached, 
nice location and priced 
for a quick sale.

3-1 3/4 ho-9 
lot, 
and

t j / a n o - ^ y

*• so v> vid v? . inor

,<n corner 
ent. Air

Ricluand Hills -3 1 3/4- 
2 Brick, built-ins, fire­
place, fenced yard, very 
nice, a good buy.

3-1 3/4 Mobile Home 
(14x75), on a 60’xl30’ 
lot, priced to sell.

Spacious 3-1 3/4 home, 
built-ins, isolated Mas­
ter Bdrm., Cent. A&H, 
buy equity and assume.

3-1 3/4 home, large kit­
chen, fenced yard, FHA 
appraised at $30,900.

2-1 home on corner lot, 
plus storage bldg. In 
Country Club. Add.

Total Energy Efficient - 
3-1 3/4-2 Brick on l'A 
acres built-ins, fire­
place and many other 
extras, close to town; 
and priced to sell.

Near Tolk: Large 3-2-2 
home on 60 ac. a good 
buy.

4-1 3/4-2 Brick, Cent. 
A&H, plus large de­
tached workshop, stor­
age and garage. An 
equity buy.

3-1 plus detached 1 car 
garage with storage, 
storm cellar, and small 
rental unit.

FARMS 
Bailey Co.

320 ac., 3-6” wells, a 
good level farm.
395 ac., 4 wells, 1 el­
ect. circle.

Parmer Co.
320 ac., 2-8” wells, 2 
elect, circles and much 
more.
320 ac., 2-8" wells, un- 
dgrd tile & pump back 
system.
200 ac., 2-8” wells, 
nice home, priced to 
sell. 1
317 ac., 2 wells, 2 cir­
cles. good established 
alfalfa.

We Appreciate 
Your Business

GEORGE & 
DIANNE NIEMAN

C A R S -T R U C K S ^

FOR SALE: 1977 Chevette 
48,000 miles. Good condi­
tion. Cash price $2,450. 
Excellent school car. Call 
272-3304 or 272-3267.

’ 8-20s-tfc

FOR SALE: 76 Kawasaki 
100, 6rt’ and off, Good con­
dition. Call 272-4643. 
9-20t-2tp

FOR SALE: 71 Chevrolet 
Suburban, e x ' l e a n ,  350 
motor. 2 V ^ \^ o iic s . 272- 
5150.
9-20t-2tc ^

FOR SALE: Honda Odys­
sey. 250 motor. $1600. 946- 
3461.
9-20t-2tc

CUSTOM BUILT: Storm 
windows and doors. Ap­
pointment and estimate. 
Call Carl Ellington at 272- 
5402.
15-15s-tfc

WE BUY refrigerators, 
freezers, washers, dryers 
working or not. Repair all 

USED TRUCKS: 77 GMC maior appliances. Haney's 
18 ft. $8000. 77 GMC 22 SwaP ShoP- 102 Ave- A -
ft. $8300. 78 GMC 18 ft. Harwell, 481-9511.
$9200. 78 GMC 22 ft. 15-17t-8tc
$9500. 77 International 15 ........................
ft. $8100. 77 International Z Z ^ T S e w
22 ft. $8300 . 78 Interna- repair> commercia,
tional 22 ft. $9300. 804 Free estimates. 10% senior
4th St.. Lubbock, Tx. citizens discount. 24-hour
9-18s-8tp service. 272-5366 or 272-
............................ ..................  4111, 221 East 4th.
FOR SALE: 1971 Chrys- 15-20t-tfc
ler. One owner. Call ............ ...................................
272-3577. PIGEONS WANTED: Will
9-19t-lfc Pay 60 cents each. Call
..............................................  1806] 364-1284 collect, in

Hereford.

' " fo r  sale ’t ,8s:8:p........
OR TRADE WANT TO BUY: 2 or 3

........................................ * '•’* BR rent house. Call 272-
USED 25 hp VHS motor 5578 or 272-3568.
and switch, $1100. Owens 15-20s-4tc
Electric, Hereford. Tx. Call ..............................................
364-3572. ALEX'S TIRE SERVICE
ll-16t-tfc For service 24 hours a day

telephone 272-5012 or Mo­
bile 965-2242. 224 East
Fourth Street, Muleshoe, 
Tx. 79347.
15-21s-stfc

FOR SALE: Like - new, 
sizes 3 to 7 Junior formats 
and prom dresses. Call 
272-5317 after 6 p.m. 
l5-16s-tfc

FOR SALE: Warm winter 
nest, furnished 2 BR trailer 
on lake LBJ with stove, 
refrigerator, washer, con- 
tral heat and air. Nice. 
272-5408. 
ll-2s-tfc

SWATHING, baling and 
hauling. 3 balers, 3 trucks. 
Call 272-4768 or 272-5254. 
15-21 s-4tc

DUDLEY ROOFING. R*j 
roof, new roof or repairs. 
772-4837.
15-18t-tfc

22 ft. real nii^Jihasta tra­
vel trailer contained.
Air co --£0V }. 272-5150.

HOUSEHOLD
GOODS

BURROWS 
UPHOLSTERY AND 

FURNITURE REPAIR 
209 W. 2nd 

phone 272-4255 
12-44s-ltc

STORAGE ROOMS 
FOR RENT 

$25.00 - $30.00 
TED BARNHILL 

272-4903 
15-14t-tfc

ATTENTION: Kirby Sales 
& Service. Call for a 
home demonstration of 
a new Kirby. We also 
have rebuilt Kirby’s. 
Starting price $235 with 
trade. 356-6110 day or 
trade. 505-356-6110 day 
or night. Joe Enis Dis­
tributor.
12-20t-8tc

MISCELLANEOUS
*■»»

FRANK'S 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICE 
PARTS & REPAIR 

315 W. 3rd Ph. 272-3822 
15-7t-tfc

. . . . . . . . . .
WANTED: To buy 160 
acres or more with owner 
financing or assumable 
FHA loan. Call 272-5578 
or 272-3568.
15-20s-4tc

WANTED TO BUY: 1955- 
56 Chevrolet sedan. Any 
condition. Box 7685 Cannon 
AFB. N.M. 88103.
15-20t-2tp

DANDELIONS or other 
weeds in your yard? Call 
Bland Pest Control. 272- 
3015.
!5-20s-lfc

WATER BUGS, ROACH­
ES, MOTHS? Call Bland 
Pest Control. 272-3015. 
15-20s-tfc

FARM
EQUIPMENT

1-1977 Hagie High Boy 
sprayer. 318 Chrysler mo­
tor hydrastat 4 - wheel 
drive, air condition, adjus­
table wheels for 30 or 40 
inch rows with ten row 
Bo-bar wichker; 50 ft. 
spray booms. 265-3322 
day or night.
10-20s-3tc

1-1979 507-7 tower Zim- 
matic pivot located at 
Muleshoe. 5-9/16” pipe, 
$17,500. 7.5 and 10 KW 
generators $800. 402-489- 
2331.
10-20s-lltp

3 SIDEROlL sprinklers 
for sale. Call 272-3056. 
10-17s-tfc

FARM LAND 
FOR LEASE

FOR SALE: 3 acres of land 
with barn and arena. North 
edge of town, 272-4701.
14-12t-tfc

LIVESTOCK
NOW STANDING: Regis­
tered AQHA Stallion, 
'Lucky Bug Rex.’ SI-88, 
Conformation, disposition, 
plus. Call 272-5317 after 6 
p.m.
16-4ttfc

WANTED: Young ’nubun 
Nanny goat and kid. /- 
364-8132 or Box 2242 
Hereford, Tx. 79045. 
l6-20s-4tp


