
4-H HONORS - Off to Chicago last week were Garza County 4-H 
members Angela Graves (left to right), Derick Dunn, tiorren Payton 
and Ron Graves. 

RAZE BOOKBINDING 
514 W. 7TH ST 
AMARILLO TX 79101 

See what fun it is 
to shop in Post City! 

The Post City Council af-
ter considerable discussion at 
its regular meeting Monday 
night, set new water, sewer 
and sanitation rates designed 
to raise enough revenue so 
that the water and sewer de-
partments would not need to 
be subsidized by the general 
revenue fund. 

The new rates will take 
affect December 15. 

Residential and commer-
cial customers will see an in-
crease on the first 5,000 gal-
lons to $4.50 and each addi-
tional 1,000 gallons at $1.25. 

Residential and commer-
cial customers outside the 

Main Street 
• 

Manager Hired 

city limits will pay a slightly 
lower percent of increase at 
$6.00 for the first 5,000 gal-
lons and $1.40 for each addi-
tional 1,000 gallons. 

Sanitation and sewer rates 
will increase also. 

The council reviewed the 
annual audit, presented by A. 
Arthur Davis, who later an-
nounced his semi-retirement. 

He has been the city au-
ditor since 1959. 

O.D. Hearne explained a 
new maintenance agreement 
being offered by GTE for its 
Post customers and said a 
new fiber optical line will be 
established for long distance 
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City Sets Water, Sewer Rates 

PMA WINNERS - (back row, left to right) Margarita Alaniz, Mary Lou Gonzales and Mary Baldree, 
along with (front row, left to right) Penny Mahon, Modena Farmer and Gazzie Harper and Jane Redman 
(not pictured) were winners in last Saturday's PMA drawings. Not present, but who's names were drawn 
were Joyce Strubhart and Joseph Espinoza. Another drawing will be held next Saturday, December 13 at 
3 p.m. Everyone is reminded to register weekly for these drawings. 
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Four to Chicago... 
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by Jan H. Crawford 
A Main Street manager 

was selected Monday, after 
interviewing highly qualified 
applicants and the decision 
was a super tough one. 

Melissa Cunningham of 
Greenville, Texas, was cho-
sen and she accepted the po-
sition Tuesday morning. 

Her background includes 
a B.A. in Economics and a 
B.A. in Political Science 
from Austin College in 
Sherman, Texas. 

Applicable areas of study 
include public finance, pub-
lic administration, urban 
economics, land economics, 
marketing and decision-
making in organizations. 

Her accolades include or-
ganizing a five state regional 
conference, establishing by-
laws and committees for the 
National Executive Network 
of 	Student 	Alumni 
Association for Austin 
College, managing all details 
of a regional newsletter for 
SAA/SF,conducting 	net- 
working seminars and 
speaking at national and re-
gional conferences, serving 
as national and regional re-
cruiter for Austin College. 

She has coordinated ap-
proximately 600 volunteers 
while raising a record high 
$188,000 	for 	the 
Alumni/Parent Phonathon for 
Austin College. 

Melissa is extremely 
qualified in motivating, 
problem solving, communi-
cating with executives at all 
levels of an organization and 
can handle administrative 
details under pressure. 

She has practical experi-
ence with retailing as a buyer 
as well as hands-on experi-
ence with display design. 

Melissa has been a re-
viewer for Texoma Regional 
Planning Commission in 
Denison, Texas as well as a 
grant researcher for the same 
organization. 

Post is lin for a great new 
destiny. 

How would you like to 
take a grand tour in unfamil-
iar territory with assurance 
that you are on the right track 
every mile of the way or 
know that you are hitting all 
the highlights without miss-
ing anything in between? 

Our new Main Street 
manager will guide us 
through this transitional pe-
riod. 

Let's keep growing and 
progressing and cooperate 
totally with Melissa! 

Thieves Get 
Computers 
from School 

Seven Apple II and 
Hitashi computers and 
monitors and a printer were 
stolen from the Post 
Elementary school early 
Monday morning, December 
3. 

Garza County Chief 
Deputy Sheriff Bill Timms 
reports that no supsects have 
been arrested. 

Timms 	says 	that 
investigating officers could 
find no evidence of forced 
entry into the building, but a 
window into the library had 
been broken. 

The computer equipment 
was in the school library. 

Anyone with information 
concerning this theft are 
urged to contact the sheriff's 
department. 

Congratulations-  goes to 
Angela Graves, Derick 
Dunn, Korren Payton, and 
Ron Graves who are attended 
National 4-H Congress in 
Chicago last week. 

These 4-H'ers won ex-
pense-paid trips based on 
their outstanding accom-
plishments in 4-H project 
work, leadership, and com-
munity service. 

Three won National hon-
ors as well as state awards. 

Angela Graves won a 
$1000 scholarship from the 
Friends of the National 4-H 
Council for her achievements 
in Home Environment, 
Korren Payton won a $1500 

calling. 
Geraldine Butler pre-

sented Mayor Pro Tern Mrs 
Maxine Earl a special plaque 
recognizing Mrs Earl's help 
in organizing the Caprock 
Cultural Association. 

"We want to publicly ex-
press our appreciation to 
you," Mrs Butler explained, 
"because if it weren't for you 
and your efforts, we might 
never have gotten such a 
great arts program going in 
Post." 

Old fashionea odds and 
ends are needed for the 
Christmas play, "My Three 
Angels," according to direc-
tor Will McCrary. 

The Garza Theater seeks 
to borrow items to lend au-
thenticity to the 1910 settings 
of the play. 

Some of the items needed 
include an oval dining room 
table, dining room side 
board, bamboo curtains, side 
chair with arms, two pair of 
wire rimmed glasses (round), 
inkwell dish with bottles and 
three old leather valises or 
suitcases. 

The box office opens 10 
a.m. to 2 p.m. daily except 
Sunday for the ticket sales of 
"My Three Angels," with a 
gala three day opening 
December 18, 19 and 20 in 
the old Garza Theater which 
is being renovated. 

Ticket buyers are being 
offered a $1 discount by Jim 
Jackson at the Chaparral 
Restaurant. 

To take advantage of the 
discount, purchasers need to 
buy the ticket in advance and 
show it to Chaparral cashier. 
Auditions 

Auditions for the February 
show, Agatha Christie's 

scholarship 	 from 
Fleischmann's Yeast for her 
accomplishments in Breads, 
and Derick Dunn won a 
$1000 scholarship from 
Pfizer, Inc. and the National 
Pork Producers Council for 
his 4-H Swine project. 

Garza County 4-H leaders 
are responsible for the out-
standing accomplishment of 
these 4-H'ers. 

A "send-off" reception 
was held for these 4-H'ers on 
Thursday, December 4. 

Patty Kirkpatrick, Post 
Chamber of Commerce 
President presented Post 

(Continued on Page 2) 

The council approved a 
recommended slate of Main 
Street Steering Committee 
members, whose task will be 
to provide support and coun-
sel to the Main Street man-
ager. 

Attending the meeting 
were Mrs Earl, council 
members Charles Wallace, 
Larry Waldrip, Larry Mills 
and Jack Alexander, city 
manager Bill Pool, secretary 
Wanda Wilkerson and city 
attorney Harvey Morton. 

murder mystery "The 
Moustrap," will be held 
December 10 from 5-6 p.m. 
at the Garza Theater. 

The Post Lions Club is 
again gearing up for their an-
nual Toys for Tots program 
this Christmas. 

They have already started 
by sending a package of toys 
and clothing to Hogar 
Infantic Cristiano,an orphan-
age home in San Salvador, El 
Salvador. 

Most children in El 
Salvador are from homes 
where the mother was raising 
the children by herself and 
had to go to work and could 
not take care of them. 

Some have been made or-
phans because of the con-
flicts there and others were 
just abandoned. 

It is reported that there are 
53 children in the orphanage 
ages ranging from three years 

Open 
House 

Thursday 
Downtown 

A Christmas Open House, 
featuring refreshments, Santa 
and a special extra prize 
drawing will be held tomor-
row by Post Merchants' 
Association members from 
6:30 to 8 p.m. 

The Christmas Open 
House is highlighted by spe-
cial in-store bargains in ad-
dition to the extra PMA 
drawing. 

Registration for this one-
time drawing begins at 6:30 
p.m. in PMA stores with the 
drawing to be held at 8 p.m. 
on East Main Street. 

Registrants must be pre-
sent at the drawing to be eli-
gible to win. 

The special Christmas 
Open House drawing is an 
extra, in addition to the reg-
ular Saturday afternoon 
drawing. 

Santa Claus will also be 
downtown 	tomorrow 
evening, and will be avail-
able to visit with youngsters 
for photographs. Santa will 
be moving from store-to-
store. 

Rehearsals begin Monday, 
January 5. 

There are parts for three 
women and six men. 

old to 15 years old. 
In this year's Toys for 

Tots program the people 
wanting to receive toys must 
fill out applications. 

These applications can be 
picked up from the SPS of-
fice or Southside Barber 
Shop. 

The toys will be delivered 
on December 23. 

Toys can be donated. 
For more information on 

how you can help with this 
program contact Jack 
Chambliss, Joe Harris or 
Leon Clary. 

The Lions are grateful for 
the response they have re-
ceived so far and look for-
ward to a great campaign this 
year. 

Garza 
County 
News 
Briefs 

Christmas Films 
Post Public Library will 

be open Saturday, December 
13 and Saturday, December 
20 to show Christmas films 
to children. 

The times are from 2 to 
3:30 p.m. 

We look forward to seeing 
your children on these dates. 

Sacred Music 
The Post Ministerial 

Alliance will be sponsoring a 
community wide sacred sing 
at the First United Methodist 
Church. 

The event will be held 
Wednesday, December 10 at 
7 p.m. 

Everyone is invited to 
attend. 
Blood Donors Wanted 

The Post Fire Department 
will hold a Blood Drive on 
December 15, 1986 from 5-9 
p.m. 

The Blood Drive will be 
held at the fire station. 

To make an appointment 
please contact any fireman. od  

The United 
Services will handle the dis-
tribution of the blood that is 
donated. 

Cheese Distribution 
The cheese distribution 

will be held Tuesday, 
December 16. - 

The distribution will be 
held at the 4-H Barn on Hwy 
84 from 9:30 - 3:30. 

Christmas Concerts 
The 5th Grade Choir will 

perform their Winter Concert 
on Sunday, December 14 at 3 
p.m., and the High School 
Choir will perform at 7 p.m. 
on Monday, December 15. 

Both concerts will be held 
at the First Christian Church 
on West 13th Street in Post. 

The public is invited to 
attend and there will be no 
charge for admission. 

Tax Seminar 
A tax seminar on new 

laws going into effect will be 
held in the Community 
Room of the First National 
Bank on Wednesday, 
December 10, 1986 at 7 p.m. 

Sponsored by the Caprock 
Cultural Association, the 
seminar, which will be con-
ducted by Mr D. Wendell 
Barnett of Barnett & Cook, 
Attorneys at Law, has been 
designed for promoting pub-
lic awareness of our chang-
ing tax laws and how they 
will affect each of us. 

There is no charge for the 
seminar. 

Nutcracker 
Approximately 120 3rd 

graders will perform in 
"Nutcracker". 

A youth musical based on 
the original ballet will be 
performed on December 18, 
1986 at lOa.m. and 2 p.m. in 
the 	Post 

 
Elementary 

Auditorium. 

Santa Claus 
Visits Post 
for Photos 

Santa Claus will be in 
Post Saturday from 10 a.m. 
to noon and from 2 to 5 p.m. 
at the Algerita Arts Center. 

In addition to visiting with 
youngsters, Santa will be 
available for photos. 

The cost of photos is $2 
each. 

Santa's visit is sponsored 
by the Post Chamber of 
Commerce. 

TheaterNeeds Old Stuf 

Lions Club Begins 
`Toys for Tots' 

it 
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Tem, Pelteet, INSURANCE 

Post's Friendly Agency 

495 3050 8 3051 
ALL FORMS OF INSURANCE 

AUTO, HOME, BUSINESS, LIFE, HEALTH 
Bonds, R.V.'s, Commerical 

SCOTCH PINE/BLUE SPRUCE/BALSAM/FIR 

Fresh Cut 

hristmasiTrees 

VOLVO 

$25 600  
MONTH 

Based on 60 month closed 
end lease. Tax, title and 
license. First payment 
and security deposit re-
quired. With approved 
credit. 

SENTRY 
SAVINGS ASSOCIATION 

Coffee 
Mugs 

ALLSUP'S GOLDEN BROWN L DELICIOUS 

Chicken 
Nuggets 

Wed., December 10, 1986  
Neel on April 2, 1925, in 
Snyder. 

He was a member of the 
First United Methodist 
Church. 

Survivors include his 
wife; a son, J.D. of Snyder, a 
sister, Livie Wilie of 
Abilene; and a granddaugh-
ter, Nancy Vaughn of Post. 

Commissioners Help Fund SPEMS 
Page 2 The Post Dispatch 

Obituary 
W.A. Vaughn 

Funeral services for W.A. 
"Bill" Vaughn, 83, of Snyder 
were 	held 	Thursday, 
December 4, 1986 at 2 p.m. 
in the Bell-Cypert Funeral 
Home with the Rev Bob 
Metzger, pastor of First 
United Methodist Church, of-
ficiating. 

He was assisted by the 
Rev Gil Fleer. 

Burial was in the Hillside 
Memorial Gardens under the 
direction of Bell-Cypert-
Seale Funeral Home. 

He died at 2:10 a.m. 
Wednesday, December 3, 
1986 in Codgell Memorial 
Hospital after a brief illness. 

He was born in Montague 
County and had lived in 
Snyder most of his life. He 
was a retired farmer and 
rancher. 

He married Nana Wade 

Letter to the Editor 
Dear Editor: 

Though we left Post in 
1948 to advance my hus-
band's banking career, we 
never lost our love for our 
"hometown". 

We have subscribed con-
tinuously all these years, en-
joying the news of folks we 
knew. 

Now there are many we 
do not know but I get elated 
over good things and 
progress there so I need the 
paper. 

Besides, I worked for Ed 
Warren. 

Best Wishes for success. 
Bonnie Cearley 

by Rodney Marshall 
The County Commission-

ers met in regular session last 
Monday, December 8, and 
allocated $2,574, their annual 
allication, to SPEMS, South 
Plains Emergency Medical 
Services. 

This service helps emer- 

City of Post Municipal Court 
Judge Louise Greene, presiding 

Judgements as of 
December4, 1986 

Jerry Dean Hambree, Slaton, 
speeding - $45. 

Manuel Lopez Zubia, fail to 
drive in a single lane - $50. 

Anna Christine Curb, fail to use 
safety restraint - $40. 

Florencio Gonzales Lopez, 
public intoxication - $195. 

Joel R. Harper, Carlsbad, N.M., 
ran red light - $40. 

Rodney Grant Mitchell, 
Mansfield, ran red light - $40. 

Larry Dewaine Padgett, 
Geneva, Ala., no Texas driver's li-
cense - $100. 

Larry Dewaine Padgett, 
Geneva, Ala., ran red light - $100. 

Pascul Deleon Romero, public 
intoxication - $110. 

James Kelly Binford, no license 
plate light - $15. 

Virgil Delyle Wilson, public 
intoxication - $135. 

Mark Odom, allow dogs to run 
at large creating a nuisance - vio-
lation of ordinance #349 Art 3 Sec. 
5.31 - $20. 

Minor, minor possession of al-
cohol - $95. 

1.41.1EN 
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gency personal to contact 
area facilities when needed. 

County Treasurer Voda 
Beth Gradine discussed the 
need of a co-signer for the 
bond which Justices of the 
Peace must have. 

The court designated 
Gradine to co-sign the bonds 

Elizarda Collazo, public intoxi-
cation - S80. 

Minor, disorderly conduct -
S110. 

Sergio Vital, public intoxica-
tion - $110. 

Mozelle Frances Osterday, 
Killeen, ran red light - $40. 

Ricky Lee Gill, expired MVI 
sticker - $40. 

Ricky Lee Gill, no proof of lia-
bility insurance - $85. 

David Packer, El Paso, speed-
ing - $38. 

Ricky Don Mindieta, public 
intoxication - $65. 

Steve Hair, theft under $20 -
$50. 

Rodney Keith Tidwell, speed-
ing - $34. 

Minor, ran stop sign - $40. 
Minor, no class "c" driver's li-

cense - $40. 
Juan Carlos Hernandez, ran 

stop sign - $40. 
Deborah Ann Martinez, fol-

lowing too close - $40. 

4 to Chicago 
(Continued from Page 1) 

patches to Korren, Angela, 
Ron and Derick. 

Other presentations to the 
four included checks to cover 
travel 	expenses 	from 
Lubbock to Dallas provided 
by Garza County Extension 
Homemakers, 	Graham 
Extension 	Homemakers 
Club, and the Post Rotary 
presented by Pru Basquez, 
and personalized portfolios 
presented by Steve Traw, 
Garza County 4-H Adult 
Leaders' 	Association 
President. 

and agreed that she was the 
logical person to co-sign 
other bonds that are needed. 

Gradine also asked if she 
could go with the commis-
sioner that discussed the an-
nual contract depository 
agreement with the bank. 

The 	commissioners 

The 	First 	Christian 
Church (FCC) Youth of Post 
will be selling tickets for a 
"Night on the Town" 
scheduled for December 18. 

The night out will include 
a steak dinner for you and 
three of your friends, then on 
to see the Christmas 
production of "My Three 
Angels" at the Garza Theater, 
all the time being chaperoned 
in a limosine. 

The drawing will be on 
Saturday, December 13 at 5 
p.m. in front of Jan's. 

Tickets may be purchased 
at Jan's, Hudman Furniture 
or from any FCC outh.  

agreed that it would be a 
good idea for her to help. 

Judge Giles Dalby sus-
tained from the bank discus-
sion. 

Vyas Motors, Inc., of 
Post, received the bid for the 
vehicle the county wanted to 
purchase. 

The youth will be also 
tickets 	in sellin

neighborhoodsg 	December 13. 

Martinez Wins 
First Place in 
Dispatch Contest 

David Martinez missed 
seven games to win first 
place in last week's Dispatch 
football contest. 

Jimmy Valdez took 
second with a miss of eight 
games. 

CONVENIENCE STORES 
• 1 9•10 

Official Court Records FCC Youth Sell Tickets 

AS LOW AS 

WE'VE GOT THE SIZE OF 
CHRISTMAS TREE 

YOU WANT AS ALLSUP'S 

"Justice should not arise 
from laws, but laws from 
justice." Joseph Joubert 

JAMES MEARS MOTORS 

1211 19TH 
	

747.2931 

With Us 
BORDEN'S DIPS OR 

our 
ream 
8 OZ. CTN. 

OMEN'S 

Egg 
Nog 

BORDEN'S 

Assorted $119 
Novelties WGT 

Shurfine Sweet 
$109 Potatoes 16 oz. 21990  

Shurfine Cranberry 5,0  
Sauce 	/6 oz. 

NOT AND GREAT TASTING-ALISUPS 

Chocolate 

BORDEN'S 

Homo , 
Milk 

Shurfine 
Charcoal 

10 LB. Bag 16 Oz. Bottles 
Coca-Cola 
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The home of Mr and Mrs Jerry Riedel was chosen last week as Best Decorated Home in the Post Merchants' Association sponsored contest. 

Z.T 
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Frazier Honored 
with Shower 

MITCHELL 
WILLIAMS 

Attorney at Law 

announces the moving of his law offices to 227 
W. Main in Post, entrance on Avenue L., for the 

L 	general practice of law. 
.10 

MEET THE NEW FACE OF 
TODAYS CHEVROLET 
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Exgairigre 

r V 

VYAS MOTORS - Harold Lucas, general sales manager; Sweety Vyas, 
Mike Vyas, owner; Charoo Vyas, Debbie Sneed, office manager; 

RAND OPE NING 
WE'RE YOUR NEW CHEVY DEALERSHIP. STOP BY AND SEE US. 
AND SEE OUR GREAT NEW LINEUP OF CHEVY CARS AND TRUCKS. 

We're happy to be the new Chevrolet dealership in 
town. And we're going all out to give you the kind 
of efficient, up-to-date service you expect and 
demand. For a start, we've got an excellent selection 
of new Chevrolet cars and trucks. We also have a 
fine choice of quality used cars. And you'll find our 
service department is state-of-the-art ready to 
keep your car or truck running right. So come on 
in and meet our informed, courteous staff. We 
really look forward to doing business with you. 

Tommy Gonzales, shop steward; Arthur Striblin, parts manager; Bud 
Goodman, mechanic; and Charles Johnson, body shop. 

111 So. Bdwy. 
Where we respect our customers 

"Buy a domestic car your job may depend on it" 495-2825 

DRIVE 
THE 

AT Vyas Motors... 

Yard Full of History 
This may be the last time 

for a while since it will prob-
ably be back in Snyder next 
year. 

The children will enjoy it 
and the young in heart will 
be thrilled also. 

So take time this 
Christmas season to take a 

look and marvel at the hard 
work and love that is being 
displayed at 801 W 6th in 
Post, Texas. 

by Rodney Marshall 
The spirit of Christmas 

can be seen at 801 W 6th in 
the way of Santa and his 
reindeer, the Nativity Scene, 
a church with a crowd of 
people singing Christmas 
carols and a family of snow-
men, all in one yard. 

The scene belongs to Mr 
and Mrs Ray Wagner of 
Snyder and is set up in the 
yard of Mr and Mrs Jerry 
Riedel of Post. 

The Wagners are going to 
be gone to Wisconsin for the 
holidays and are leaving it 
with their daughter to display 
for the people in Post and 
Garza County. 

The scenery started about 
10 years ago when the 
Wagners decided to build a 
Nativity Scene to put in their 
yard for the Christmas sea-
son. 

The next year they added 
angels to the scene and the 
list grew on and on. 

The decorations have built 
quite a reputation for the 
Wagner's through the years. 

"We always have had a 
line of cars come by our 
house every year just to see 
the set up," says Mr Wagner. 

Many people get out of 
their car to see the set up, es-
pecially that of the church 
which has several pews filled 
with people and music being 
heard from it. 

"One night we forgot to 
turn on the lights and we sure 
heard about it," recalls Mr 
Wagner in explaining why he 
bought a timer for the light-
ing system. 

But since they are leaving 
for the holidays they wanted 
to leave the scenery in good 
hands. 

"We hope the people of 
Post appreciate it," stated Mr 
Wagner. 

In listening to the 
Wagners tell of their work 
and love for this project I 
cannot help but feel that 
many people will enjoy this 
decoration this Christmas 
season. 

The Wagners are not fin-
ished, wanting to build 
Santa's workshop for next 
year. 

You will be able to see 
this scenery through New 
Years. 

A kitchen and bath 
shower honored Jeri Frazier, 
bride-elect of Jeffery Riedel, 
in the home of Mary Nell 
Holly, Saturday. 

Refreshments of cake 
decorated in lavender and 
white roses was served with 
thumbprint cookies and lime 
sherbert punch. 

Approximately 	thirty 
guests were registered. 

Special guests were 
Naomi Denning of Lubbock 
and Jeri's mother, Mrs Rita 
Gibson of Levelland and 
Jeff's mother, Mrs Sheri 
Riedel. 

Hostesses for the shower 
were Mary Nell Holly, Carla 
Odom, Teri Riedel and 
Peggy Lofton. 

The hostesses presented 
the honoree with individual 
gifts. 
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Fannon has 

Old Fashion 

Pounding 

Lana Fannon, bride-elect 
► of Ricky Benton, was pre-

sented an old fashioned 
pounding to fill her cupboard 
at the home of Ricky's aunt, 
Sheri Riedel. 

A lavender and pink deco-
rated cake along with 
thumbprint cookies and a 
jello punch were served. 

Special guests were Mrs 
Gloria Fannon of Floydada, 
Mrs Susan Warren, Ricky's 
mother and Irene Wagner, 
Ricky's grandmother of 
Snyder. 

Hostesses were Starlet 
Riedel, Debbie Callie, Teri 
Riedel, Pauline Clinesmith 
and Sheri Riedel. 



December 4, 1936 
Mr and Mrs Barnie Jones 
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December 4, 1986 
Mr and Mrs Barnie Jones 

Mon-Sat 
10:00-5:00 (806)495-2314 

Lcittlrit  FREE TAX 
SEMINAR 

Are you interested in the new tax law and how it 
will affect you? 

If so, you'll want to put December 10, 7 p.m. on 
your calendar and plan to attend a seminar at the 
First National Bank Community Room. The event is 
sponsored by the Caprock Cultural Association and 
features D. Wendell Barnett of Barnett and Cook 
Attorneys at Law of Lubbock, specialists in tax 
law. 

The seminar is free and is designed to promote 
public awareness of our changing laws and how they 
will affect each of us. 

We are very pleased to be able to offer this 
service to our friends and customers. 

December 10, 7 p.m. 
First National Bank 
Community Room 

        

        

        

THE FIRST 	 
NATIONAL BANK 

216 W Main 	 495-2804 

I 

Jones Celebrate 
Golden Anniversary 
Mr and Mrs Barnie Jones 

celebrated their fifieth wed-
ding anniversary with a re-
ception November 30 in the 
Community Room of the 
First National Bank. 

Jones and the former 
Evelyn Sanders were married 
December 4, 1936 in Snyder 
on her parents 44th wedding 
anniversary. 

They were married in a 
double 	wedding 	with 
Evelyn's 	brother, 	Ellis 
Sanders and the former 
Florence Hall. 

Mr and Mrs Sanders, of 
Abilene, were special guests 
at the reception. 

There were 225 guests 
registered for the reception. 

Out of town guests were 
from Abilene, Midland, 
Lamesa, Lubbock, Eden, 
Brownfield; 

	

Tahoka, 	Slaton, 

	

Littlefield, 	Levelland, 
Cactus, McAdoo, Rotan, Fort 
Worth, Seagraves, Big 
Spring, Roswell, N.M., 
Merkel, Snyder, Clarendon 
and Seminole. 

Hosts for the occasion 
were children of the couple, 
Clarence and Oneita Gunn, 
Darrell and Ruby Jones of 
Post, and Norman and Reta 
Fern Settlemire of Woodrow. 

The couple have eight 
grandchildren and two great-
grandchildren and all of them 
were present for the celebra-
tion. 

V.F.W. Ladies Auxiliary News for November 
111.4dtay Cosmestics, for 110 

your beauty needs. 
'Skin Care 
'Glamour 

'Fragrance 
'Holiday Gift Line 

Call for more information 
Susan Poff 
3415-91st 

Lubbock 806-797-7052 
[call collect] 

Diane Stewart 
P.O. Box 222 

Slaton, Texas 79364 
806-828-4981 

by Mary Mann 
November 4 was meeting 

night with nine members pre-
sent. 

Claudette Gill was winner 
of the attendance cash pot. 

Plans were made for the 
District 7 Convention that 
was here at Post 6797 the 8 
& 9 of November. 

A large crowd attended. 

The convention was very 
nice. 

The Ladies Auxiliary fur-
nished the food for the dinner 
on Sunday the 9 of 
November. Turkey and 
dressing and all the trim-
mings was prepared and 
served by Carol, Lanora and 
Beluah Eilenberger. They did 
a great job. 

The salad's and desserts 
were made by Lola Ryan, 
Melvis Taylor, Cathy Morris, 
Rosemary Stelzer, Dena 
Morgan and Jo Ella Sparlin. 

Mary Sneed and Maleccy 
Johnston furnished the cran-
berry sauce. 

Maleccy Johnston and 
Helyn Fields made all the 
decorations and Maleccy 
Johnston was voted Harvest 
Queen. 

-Lathan Chance Brinker 
was honored with a get ac-
quainted shower Sunday, 
December 7, in the 
Community Room of the 
First National Bank. 

Zoe Kirkpatrick and 
Chance greeted the guests, as 
his mother, DeeDee Brinker, 
opened gifts. 

Christmas flowers were 
used throughout the room. 

She was crowned and pre-
sented a fruit basket and a 
bottle of champagne. 

The convention and dance 
was enjoyed by everyone. 

The 11 of November was 
visiting day at Golden Plains 
Care Center. Jo Ella Sparlin 
and Maleccy Johnston served 
peach cobbler, that was made 
by Melvin Taylor and cake 

from Dena Morgan. They 
also served punch. 

The 18 of November was 
the next meeting night with 
eight members present. 

Helyn Fields name was 
drawn for the attendance 
cash pot, but she wasn't 

The serving table featured 
a Christmas wreath with 
guests served cookies and hot 
spiced punch from brass ap-
pointments. 

A car seat was the gift of 
the 	hostesses: 	Patty 
Kirkpatrick, Jeri Lott, Zoe 
Kirkpatrick, Pam Humble, 
Dena Kirkpatrick and Janet 
Peel. 

Shedd 
Promoted 

to Sgt. 
Steven M. Shedd, son of 

William E. and Doris E. 
Shedd of Aspermont, Texas, 
has been promoted in the 
U.S. Army to the rank of 
sergeant. 

Shedd is a military police 
specialist in West Germany, 
with the 59th Air Defense 
Artillery. 

His wife, Linda, is the 
daughter of Charles D. 
Kirkland of Haskell, Texas 
and Colleen R. Witt of Post, 
Texas.  

there, so the money stays in 
the pot. 

The Auxiliary sent $50 to 
Cancer Aid & Research. 
They also voted to send food 
to Meals on Wheels, which 
they did. 

The Auxiliary gave away 
a turkey for Thanksgiving. 
The drawing was on Tuesday 
the 25. Richard Sanchez won 
the turkey. 

The 25 of November was 
also visiting day at Twin 
Cedars. 

Dink Boren and Jo Ella 
Sparlin served peach cobbler, 

coviorz 4-4~z coit1/4P-04-Notarz a-eotavz catacrz 

DANISH 
IMPORTS 
GIFTS & COLLECTABLES 

201 East Main • Post, Texas 

Trim a Tree! 

 

All Ornaments 

30% OFF 
 

Thursday, December 11 Open til 8:30 

,A€746 
	

*aiche4 

SPieie/&ng 
	Ylock'ny ,940.44 

Extended Hrs. Starting 

Thursday, Dec. 11 8:00 am - 6:00 pm 

(915)573-1508 
Snyder, Texas 79549 
College Heights Shopping Centel 

holidays ty 	holidays 
aPOY• 	 aPOY" 

.1••• 

••-*9-laps 
'Ho) days 

 

 

Season's Greetings with 

"Message in a Bottle"... 

Bottle your feelings along 

with Gourmet Popping Corn 

only s 6 95  

 

V 

✓ 

✓ 

 

Utica Bath Towels from J.P. Stevens 

  

 

dans 

 

 

Yeiae, crit/x,evele4. 
eYnittige/nee4. • • 

Gift Wrapping Service 

  

 

211 E. Main 
	

495-3311 

 

Chance Brinker Honored 
with Get Acquainted Shower 

• 	.*HaPPY•  
halidaYS 

`flaPPI-
holidar3 

baked by Cathy Morris and 
cake by Jo Ella Sparlin. They 
also served punch. 

We hope everyone; had a 
nice Happy Thanksgiving. 

Dr. Lewis Moore 
OPTOMETRIS 
Announces New Office 

Hours for 1986 
Complete Visual Care 

Thursday 9:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

206 West Main 495-3687 

+Pi r 	....if 	'HaPPY" 1' ....% 
a")  

lio hien `Holidays 

Here Comes Santa Claus! 

IN POST 
SATURDAY 

10 am to Noon 

2pm to 5 pm 

Algerita Art Center 

Photographs 

with Santa svo 

Sponsored by the 
Post 

Chamber of Commerce 

.....L. 
••-: 9 lappy- 	t..C .,....;it.' ,.) 

..-.10" 	'Happy-
li  ' ol.days 	 'Holidays 

44 
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WE GIVE S&H GREEN STAMPS EVERY DAY 
EilL  DOUBLE STAMPS ON WEDNESDA 
MEMNON 	

with purchase of $2.50 or more, excluding cigarette_s_—_—. 
• 

Charmin 
Bath 

While Supplies Last 
No Rain Checks 
No Sales to Dealers 
Quantity Rights Reserved 

Sugar Sam 

YAMS 

23 oz. cans 

Hormel 
Chili 
(No bean) 

15 oz. 

Sunhine 

PECANS 
6 oz. 

Halves or 
Pieces 

25% 
OFF 

QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED • NO SALES TO DEALERS 
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BOLD GOLD 
SUFER 
SAVING 

Post Store only 
Prices Good through December 13, 1986 



Page 6 The Post Dispatch Wed., December 10, 1986 



aullsr°  
• •" 

%API_ 

The Post Dispatch Wed., December 10, 1986 Page 7 

now for delicious 
Iiiindk:Tre, 

Keep playing 

EXTRA 
1111 101111111111111111111111111111111111m.mw 

ene 
Ostia 
"Liv 

unda TAMPS EVERY DAY,  
1=11111111•11111M1111111ON"' 

III 

N WEDNESDAY eve 

to at 

UNITED TRU TENDR 
OR USDA CHOICE 

BONELESS 
TOP SIRLOIN 

STEAK 

t3 

VE 

98
wij 
u1 

tr.  

32 OZ. 
FOR 

2 LB. BAG • 69 

, 

184:T-2. :14 

• - 	- 
a_cm: 

'-1'\ • 	J-; 	--• • 
'h.(•:',:- ..- .- . 	....,, , 	- 

	

. 	... - 
- 	1, 	d.;•-).. •• '• 

	

. 	. 

1 • 

f‘4"kei.,it's 

IC 
in 



Let McGinnis Make Your 
Christmas 

FREE 
With the purchase of every new 

vehicle receive a $200 Gift Certificate 
to Playhouse Toys & Gifts. 

6913 Indiana Ave. 	 Lubbock, Texas 

All Cavaliers - incl. Z24 	$300 GM Cash Incentive 

1986 S-10 Long Bed Pick Up 
1986 S-10 Long Bed Pick up; fuel injected V6 
engine; 4 speed manual, air conditioned, 20 gallong 
tank, AM radio, sport stripes. Stock # 6-7131. List 
$11,280. 

List $11,280 
Special $8,610 

1986 Silverado Pick Up 
1/ 2  Ton 

1986 Half ton Silverado pick up gray/dark blue 
special paint, V8, automatic, air conditioned, cruise 
control, tilt steering, door locks and power windows. 
Loaded - slight hail damage - Company Exclusive 
Vehicle. Stock # 6-7193. List $14,847. 

Special $11,494 
Vehicle price includes any wind or hail damage credits. 

(806) 828-6261 
	

Slaton, Texas 79364 

List $14,847 

Liquor Sale 
10% Off 

(of all liquor) 
fifths, quarts & half-gallons ONL Y 

B & B Liquor 
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Manna for Main Street 
by Jan H. Crawford 

"Yes, Virginia, there is a 
Santa Claus." 

The famous editorial 
written by Francis P. Church 
first appeared in The New 
York Sun in 1897 at the re-
quest of eight year old 
Virginia O'Hanlon. 

She had been told by 
some of her friends that there 
was no Santa Claus. 

SANTA EXISTS! 
If not, the world would 

not be as dreary as if there 
were no Virginias! 

Santa has already visited 
Post. 

Our big present this year 
is MAIN STREET. 

To keep you posted (no 
pun intended) I will bring 
you up to date on this pro-
ject. 

The program is moving 
ahead rapidly and I like that! 

To date, a committee, 
Mayor Giles McCrary, city 
manager Bill Pool, Vice-
President Post Merchants  

Association, Jan Crawford 
and local merchant, Curtis 
Hudman have been inter- 
viewing 	applicants 	for 
Project Manager. 

This position will be the 
key figure to the SUCCESS 
OF MAIN STREET and all 
applicants are carefully 
screened. 

The decision of selection 
will be extremely difficult as 
all applicants are highly 
qualified and enthusiastic 
about working for the city of 
Post. 

'Post is ripe for new in-
dustry. 

When Burlington closed it 
left behind RESOURCES in 
terms of Labor and 
Management that could be 
used by start-up companies. 

These talents COULD and 
SHOULD be used. 

In a forest one will not 
find a lot of new trees grow-
ing beneath the tallest one. 

It is in the areas where the 
big trees have fallen and 
where there is the most sun-
light that the new growth oc-
curs. 

Births 
Lathan Brinker 

Jim and Dee Dee Brinker 
are proud to announce the 
birth of their son, Lathan 
Chance Brinker. 

Lathan 	was 	born 
November 16, 1986 at 
Methodist 	Hospital 	in 
Lubbock. 

He weighed seven pounds 
and seven ounces and was 21 
1/2 inches long at birth. 

Paternal grandmother is 
Sharon Brinker of Lubbock. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Jimmy and Delores Redman 
of Post. 

Rachel Redman 
Dale and Penny Redman 

are proud to announce the 
birth of their daughter, 
Rachel Nicole Redman, born 
December 1, 1986 at St 
Mary's Hospital in Lubbock. 

Rachel weighed eight 
pounds and nine ounces and 
was 20 1/4 inches long at 
birth. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Jimmy and Delores Redman 
of Post. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Sherry and Robert Scott of 
Loop. 

Koby James Baumann 
Mr and Mrs Kelly 

Baumann of Hobbs, N.M., 
announce the birth of a son, 
Koby James, born December 
4, 1986 at 4:40 p.m. in St 
Mary's of Lubbock. 

Koby weighed six pounds 
and four ounces and was 19 
3/4 inches long at birth. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr and Mrs Leon Davis of 
Post. 

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr and Mrs A.J. Baumann of 
Post. 

Maternal great-grandpar-
ents are Julia Howard of Post 
and J.C. Howard of Coleman 
and T.F. and Ruby Nell 
Davis of Post. 

Paternal great-grandparent 
is J.D. Saffel of Post. 

Maternal 	great-great- 
grandmothers are Martha 
Dunn of Santa Anna and 
Oma Howard of Coleman. 

Post Menu 
December 15 - 19 
Monday, Dec. 15 

Breakfast - Assorted cereal, 
toast, peanut butter, honey, fruit, 
milk. 

Lunch - Frito pie, tossed salad, 
pork & beans, mixed fruit, corn 
bread, milk. 

Tuesday, Dec. 16 
Breakfast - Malt-o-meal, 

sausage, toast, orange juice, milk. 
Lunch - Hot dogs with chili, 

mixed greens, pinto beans, birth-
day cake, home made buns, milk. 

Wednesday, Dec. 17 
Breakfast - Assorted cereal, 

toast, peanut butter, honey, fruit, 
milk. 

Lunch - Ham, gravy, sweet 
potatoes, green beans, cherrie cob-
bler, cheese rolls, milk. 

Thursday, Dec 18 
Breakfast - Oatmeal, bacon, 

toast, orange juice, milk. 
Lunch - Taco's with sauce, 

green salad, buttered corn, purple 
plums, milk. 

Friday, Dec 19 
Breakfast - Cinnamon rolls, 

mixed fruit, milk. 
Lunch - Bar-b-que on bun, 

french fries, cabbage slaw, fudge 
cookies, home made buns, milk. 

Artist of 

the Month 
Carole Hutto of Post has 

been selected "Artist of the 
Month" by the Post Art Guild 
Inc. 

A collection of her works 
will be on display at the First 
National Bank of Post 
through the month of 
December. 

Carole and her family 
moved to Post five years ago. 

She is married to J.A. 
(Buddy) Hutto. 

They have four children, 
Toni, a recent graduate of the 
University of Texas; Lisa, 
recently graduated from 
South Plains School of 
Cosmetology; Kim, presently 
attending Metro Barber 
College of Lubbock; and 
John, a sophomore at Post 
High School. 

Carole says, "We love 
Post and really appreciate the 
variety of cultural activities 
available, especially the Post 
Art Guild." 

She joined the Guild a 
year ago and is in "the 
learning process". 

She has attended work-
shops conducted by Yvonne 
Swinney, Jeannie Elliott and 

Adult Education 

Classes Open 
The Adult Education 

Classes will hold their last 
class before Christmas on 
Wednesday, December 10. 

The classes will resume 
Monday, January 5 with 
classes meeting in the 
Middle School Learning 
Center on Monday and 
Wednesday evenings from 7-
9:30 p.m. 

Anyone interested in 
working toward their G.E.D. 
or in improving their educa-
tion should come and register 
any Monday or Wednesday 
evening. 

The door is always open. 

Paul Milosovitch. 
Painting has always inter-

ested her and upon moving to 
Post and receiving encour-
agement from her family and 
member of the Post Art 
Guild, she has realized this 
ambition. 

:1W4tiael"!latt 

Painting is not only fun, 
it's therapy, Carole says and 
believes anyone with the de-
sire can paint. 

Carole was recently 
elected to the office of 
Program Chairman for the 
1987-88 term. 

Check 5afetg  
Make the Holidays 
Bright 	 

 	Before hanging strings of lights, 
1'1 spread them on the floor and check for 

frayed or bare wires, cracked insula-
tion, loose connections, and damaged 

plugs or light sockets. 

	 Check extension cords for 
wear or damage and don't run 

them across walking areas. 

0 Test lights before putting them on the 
tree. Unplug them before making repairs 

or replacing bulbs. 

 	Overloading circuits with too many 
lights can cause fire. Follow manufac-

turer's instructions about the number 
of lights allowed on one circuit. 

 	Choose a fresh, green tree, trim its 
base and keep it in plenty of water. If the 

needles are brown and break off 
easily, it could be a fire risk. 

 	If you buy an artificial tree, make sure 
it has been tested for flammability by 

Underwriters Laboratories (UL). 

El Place your tree away from the 
fireplace or other heat sources 

and out of the traffic pattern. 

0 Never string lights on a metallic 
tree. Light strings with damaged insulation 

can electrically charge a metallic tree. 
Instead, shine unattached colored floodlights 

or spotlights on the tree. 

0 Always turn off lights before leaving 
home or going to bed. You'll save money 

and be safer, too. 

0 Never use lighted candles on a tree or 
near evergreens. And don't burn ever-

greens in the fireplace. 

❑ Do not use inside lights on the outside. 
All outside lighting equipment, including 

lights, cords and plugs, should be 
waterproof and made for outdoor use. 

Also, hang sockets downward and 
don't leave a socket empty. 

 	When hanging lights on the rooftop 
or in tall trees outdoors, stay clear of 

electrical lines. Make sure you or 
your decorations don't come 

in contact with them. 

0 Should you receive a CB radio or 
television this Christmas, let a qualified 

serviceman install the CB base unit 
or television antenna for you. 

This delicate job is best left to the 
professionals. 

[1:1 Be sure electrical toys are tested for 
safety. Look for the UL mark. 

SOUTHWESTERN 
PUBLIC SERVICE COMPANY 

9301 



To Roby To Gail 

39 

38 

37 

36 

$HOP SNYDER AND $AVE 
Appliances 

18 Roe's Furniture, 4001 Highland Shopping Ctr. 
41 McWhorter's, 1701 25th St. 
37 Western Auto, 2510 Ave. R. 
36 Bob's True Value, 2518 Ave. R 

1 Hoyt's Furniture & Appliance, 2112 25th 

Arts & Crafts 

35 Memories Made, 2524 Ave. R. 

Athletic Supplies 
13 Snyder Athletic Center, 3219 College 

Bicycles 
36 Bob's True Value, 2518 Ave. R 

Books & Records 
6 Snyder Book Store 

& Gift Shop, 2517 College Ave. 

Children's & Infant's Wear 
30 Li'l Rascals, 1806 26th 
28 Cedar Closet, 30th St. & College Ave. 

Department Stores 
25 Anthony's, 3210 College Ave. 
23 Kmart, 3500 College 

Financial 
40 Snyder National Bank, 1715 25th St. 

8 West Texas State Bank, 1901 26th St. 

Furniture & Appliances 
37 Western Auto, 2510 Ave. R 
1 Hoyt's Furniture, 2112 25th 

18 Roe's Furniture, 4001 Highland Shopping Ctr. 

Gifts 
20 Special Moments, 4200 College 
6 Snyder Book Store 

& Gift Shop, 2517 College 
31 Express It, 1804 26th St. 
22 Burgess-McWilliams Pharmacy, 3706 College 
15 Snyder Drug, 3609 College 

3 Merle Norman, 2507 College Ave. 
38 Four Seasons Hallmark, 2502 Ave. R. 

Ladies' Fashions 
29 Margaret's, 1818 26th St. 
27 Shadras, College Ave. & 30th 
3 Merle Norman, 2507 College Ave. 
11 Bar-H-Bar, 3205 College Ave. 
32 Mildred's Dress Shop, 2606 Ave. R. 
39Sunnyside, 2500 Ave. R. 
5 Jodi's, 2511 College Ave. 

12 Clothesline, 3413 Snyder Shopping Ctr. 

14 J.M.'s Fashions Unique, 3421 College Ave. 
(Full Figure) 

Men's Clothing 
13 Snyder Athletic, 3219 College Ave. 
17 Suits Us, 1908 37th St. 

Music Stores 
4 Smith's Music Place, 2509 College Ave. 

Restaurants 
24 McDonald's, 3414 College 
19 K-Bob's Steak House, 4604 College Ave. 
2 Spanish Inn, 2212 College Ave. 

21 Sonic Drive In, 4100 College Ave. 
42 The Shack, 1005 25th St. 

Sewing 
7 Blanche's Bernina, 1910 26th St. 

Shoes & Boots 
34 Thompson's Shoe Store, 2526 Ave. R. 

Toys 
16 Toys Galore, 37th St. Shopping Ctr. 

Travel Agency 
26 Snyder Travel, 3018 Varsity Square 

Western Wear 

11 Bar-H-Bar, 3205 College 
33 Koda Kountry, 1722 26th St. 

Young Miss 
28 Cedar Closet, 30th & College Ave. 

35 

34 

SNYDER SERVES YOU 

33 

32 

on 
u.0i4p6 m o 

NIGHTLY 6-9 P.M. 
Thurs. & Fri. Dec. 11 & 12 
Thurs. & Fri., Dec. 18 & 19 
Mon. & Tue., Dec. 22 & 23 

Greeting Cards 
38 Four Seasons Hallmark, 2502 Ave. R. 
22Burgess-McWilliams Pharmacy, 3706 College 
15Snyder Drug, 3609 College 

Home Entertainment 
9 M&M Electronics, 1910 27th St. 

41 McWhorter's, 1701 25th 
37 Western Auto, 2510 Ave. R. 

Jewelry 
10 McLeod's Jewelers, 3411 Ave. T 

Junior Fashions 
5 Jodi's, 2511 College Ave. 

12 Clothesline, 3413 Snyder Shopping Ctr. 

To Clairemont 
To Post 

U.S. Hwy 84  

 

0 

       

        

25th Street 

  

ao 

  

25th St. (Hwy. 180) 

 

         

SNYDER 
SQUARE 

26th St. 
	

D 
To Colorado City 

22 

21 

20 

19 

42nd St. 

27th St. EIC] 

:0 30th St. 

25 Z6 

37th St. 

To Big Spring 
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Girls Place Third 

Tyra Alexander is agressive on defense for the varsity Lady Lopes. 
(Photo courtesy of Post High School by Kimberly Burnett) 

DOWE MAYFIELD 
Jefferson Standard Life 
7204 Joliet #3, Lubbock 

806-797-8089 
Life, Health, Mutual Funds 

Stop by and see our selection 

of John Deere toys. 

Many to Choose from. 

We also have 
the stripper parts you need. 

Bryant Farm Supply 
828-5811 	 Slaton, Texas 

We're going to rewrite 
your phone book soon. 

Do you want 
us to make any changes? 

Before the presses roll on the new edi-
tion of your phone book, take a minute to 
check: 

Make sure you're listed correctly. 
Or tell us if you'd like more listings (the 

kids, a relative, or your spouse, for 
example). 

After all, it's your phone book. When you 
see your name in print, it ought to be the  

way you want to see it. 
So, if you want any changes or additions, 

let us tell you what the charges might be, if 
any. Just call our business office now. 

by Rodney Marshall 
The girls varsity basketball 

team won the first, lost the second 
and won the last game of the 
Coahoma Basketball Tournament 
to place third in the tournament. 

Kim Smith was elected on the 
All Tournament team. 

First Game 
Big Springs JV 

75-17 
Kim Smith pumped in 23 

by Rodney Marshall 
The Post Antelope basketball 

team won the Consolation title at 
the Coahoma Tournament this past 
weekend, losing their first game 
but winning the last two games. 

Marvin Lee was selected on the 
All Tournament team. 

First Game 
Snyder JV 

54-53 

points in the 75-17 win. 
Tyra Alexander connected for 

eight points while Darby Gordon, 
Laura 	Crenshaw, 	Christina 
Martinez, Keitha White and Teresa 
Lofton all had six points. 

Traci Tannehill dropped in two 
points to round out the scoring. 

Second Game 
Coahoma 

49-47 
The girls hit a cold streak in the 

Marvin Lee led the scoring in 
this game with 19 points. 

Alfredo Soria pumped in 11 
points, Steve Price connected for 
nine, Jay McCook added six and 
Dustin Ammons had two. 

Second Game 
Tahoka 

60-58 
McCook led the Antelopes in  

third quarter scoring only seven 
points while Coahoma rolled up 23 
in the two point loss. 

Smith again led the scoring 
with 20 points followed closely by 
Gordon having 15 points. 

Martinez connected for seven 
points, Alexander had four and 
Holleman added two. 

Third Game 
Forsan 
60-39 

their first win of this tournament 
scoring 15 points. 

Lee followed closely with 14 
points and Gatzki and Price 
connecting for 10 each. 

Windham had nine and 
Greathouse put in two points. 

Third Game 
Forsan 
69-61 

The Post Junior Varsity boys 
basketball team lost to Spur JV 43-
26 Tuesday night, December 2, in 
Post. 

The Post JV was ahead 18-16 at 
half-time put went cold in the 
second half. 

"We played well for the first 
half but we got tired about the end 
of the third quarter," said Coach 
Lester Titsworth. 

Michael McClain led the 

The Post girls varsity basket-
ball team ran over Spur, 55-37, in a 
game played here Tuesday, 
December 2. 

The girls exploded with 24 
points in the second quarter to 
build a big lead that was never 
challenged. 

Kim Smith led all scorers with 
23 points, Tyra Alexander added 
nine, Jenny Hudman connected for 

The Antelope girls ran past 
Forsan in the second, third and 
fourth quarters in taking Third 
Place in the Coahoma Tournament. 

Smith pumped in 20 points 
with Gordon adding 14 and 
Martinez having 13 points. 

Alexander connected with four 
points while Lofton had two and 
Holleman added one. 

Jumping out to a 20-14 first 
quarter lead the Antelopes won the 
Consolation title of the Coahoma 
Tournament beating Forsan 69-61. 

Lee pumped in 23 points to 
lead the win. 

McCook followed with 18 
points, 	Gatzki 	collected 
12,Windham sank eight, Price had 
six and Greathouse two points. 

scoring for Post with eight points 
followed by Brook Capps with six 
and Robert Stanley sinking five 
points. 

Daryl Foster popped in four 
points, Tyge Payne added two and 
Gilbert Valdez had one point. 

The Junior Varsity's next game 
will be here against Colorado City 
on Tuesday, December 16, starting 
at 5 pm. 

eight and Angie Holleman had 
seven. 

Darby Gordon sank four points, 
Christina Martinez and Teresa 
Lofton had two points each to 
round out the scoring. 

Boys Lose 
in Overtime 
The Post boys basketball team 

lost to Spur last Tuesday, 
December 2, to Spur 65-59 at the 
High School Gym. 

The Antelopes fell behind 20-6 
in the first quarter but ended the 
game with a 53-53 tie. 

They were outscored 12-6 in 
the overtime period. 

Jay McCook led the scoring 
with 16 points followed closely by 
Mike Gatzki with 13 and Marvin 
Lee adding 12. 

Greg Windham connected for 
10, Steve Price and Alfredo Soria 
had three apiece and Lee Wayne 
Greathouse sank two points.  

points while Dianne Ammons 
added six. 

Ruby Perez collected three and 
Laura Norman, Becky Shumard, 
Shelly Wells, Raline Bagby, 
Alexander and Allen all added two 
points to round out the scoring. 

Third Game 
Plainview Red 

27-19 
The girls fell behind 17-8 at 

halftime but came back to hold 
Plainview scoreless in the fourth 
period to tie the game and hold 
them scoreless again in the over-
time for the victory which awarded 
them the Consolation title of the 
tournament. 

Woods again led the scoring 
with 14 points and Angela Wallace 
added five. 

Alexander and Allen added 
three apiece and Shumard had two 
points. 

The seventh grade girls basket-
ball team won the Consolation title 
in the Slaton Tournament this past 
weekend losing their first game but 
winning the next two for the title. 

First Game 
Plainview Blue 

26-16 
The girls put up a good fight 

but were ten points behind at the 
end of the game. 

Trudy Woods scored seven 
points while Stacy Perez added 
three. 

Sara Alexander, Sandy Allen 
and Misty Bartlett all added two 
points each for the scoring. 

Second Game 
Cooper "B" 

31-8 
The girls built a 6-0 lead at the 

end of the first quarter that gradu- 
ally grew to the 31-8 victory. 

Woods led the scoring with 10 

El Matamoros 
(Under new management) 

Leon Seals 

Breakfast specials 	  1.59 
Lunch 	 3  00 

We have a new menu - 
Fish Fry on Fridays 

3.50 - All you can eat 
Thank you 

We appreciate your business 

Cash and Carry 
Farm and Ranch Store 

Now open at 114 S. Ave I 

Post, Texas 

495-4128 
We carry all processed feed and animal supplies. 

Open 9-5 Mon-Fri 

9-1 Sat 
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Breast Cancer Clinic 
*** A mobile mammography Xray unit from 

Women's and Children's Hospital Odessa, Texas 
*** Fully staffed with female technicians 

*** Privacy!! Confidentiality 

Friday, December 19 
9 a.m. til 7 p.m. 

$50 total 
Call 495-2828 for appointment 

Now we can see it before you can feel it. When 
it's no bigger than the dot on this page. 

And when it's 90% curable. With the best 
chance of saving the breast. 

The trick is catching it early. And that's exactly 
what a mammogram can do. 

A mammogram is a simple x-ray that's simply 
sthe best news yet for detecting breast cancer. 

And saving lives. 
If you're over 35, ask your doctor about 

mammography. 
Give yourself the chance of a lifetime. 

Boys Win Consolation 

Steve Price has a high reach for the varsity 
of Post High School by Christina Martinez) 

J. V. Boys Lose to Spur 

Varsity Girls Romp 

7th Grade Girls Place at Slaton 

Best Christmas Decorated 
Home Contest 

Official Entry Form 
Complete this form and mail to 

PMA 
Drawer 610 

Post, Texas 79356 

Name 	  
Address 	  
Telephone 	  
Date of entry 	  

Judging will begin November 28 with four weekly winners 
announced each week through December 19 with a S50 gift 
certificate redeemable at any PMA member. Decision of the judges 
is final. 

Sponsored by the Post Merchants' Association. 	i 
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Feed Store 
Reopening Soon 

Continue to get 

your feed at 

Stanley Transport 
Clairemont Hwy. 

495-2643 

Antelopes. (Photo courtes y 



TRANSPORT 

WANTED FURS 
Top Market Price 

Location: Terry's Tires 
on Hwy 84 

Fridays - Beginning Dec. 12 
through fur season 

12:15 p.m. to 12:45 p.m. 

Arledge Fur Company 
Box 1460 

305 Yoakum St 
Rockdale, Tx 

512-446-2434 or 2686 

rta 

Town & Country Review 
Copyright 1986 by Connie Logan Advertising Company, Inc., Oklahoma City, Okla. 
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Wilson Independent Insurance Agency, Inc. 

A complete, dependable, and experience insurance company is as near as your telephone. 
Call Wilson Independent Insurance Agency located at 2000 Green Ave in Wilson, phone 628-6411, for 

your insurance against the loss of your home, farm buildings, crops and general needs. 
This insurance company has served this community reputably and efficiently for years and will be 

happy to assist you. 
Call them today or visit them for counsel on coverage of your home, farm buildings, and your loved 

ones. 
They are trained in the field of insurance and well qualified to be of guidance to you. 
They extend best wishes for a Happy Holiday Season. 

B & B Liquor Store 
B & B Liquor Store, located at 114 South Ave. Fin Post, phone 495-3150, is the place to go for your 

favorite brands of imported and domestic wines, liquors or beer. 
This liquor store offers a complete stock of nationally advertised brands at reasonable prices. 
If you want the best quality, they have it, if you want popular priced brands, they also have them. 
Quality and service, while offering the utmost value for your liquor dollars, have contributed to the 

success they have enjoyed. 
The convenient location of this store makes it a handy place to pick up refreshments you need for that 

important party. 
Their location has led to patronage from people from the surrounding areas. 
There are so many different brands of wines and liquors on the market today that unless you have 

established a favorite brand by actual usage, you need the advice of a reliable dealer like this one. 
The ownzr and employees extend best wishes for a Merry Christmas and safe New Year. 

Sue & Sons Trucking 
When you send goods by truck, you want them delivered swiftly, efficiently and dependably, delivered 

when you want it where you want it. 
Sue & Sons Trucking located on Hwy 82 in Rails, offers you their services, maintaining that their 

experience in this field and their modem hauling equipment will give you the service you desire. 
Sue & Sons Trucking has established a reputation of competent service throughout this area and in this 

community and believes that this stands as their guarantee of a satisfactory trucking job. 
For your assurance of a swift delivery, they have the hauling equipment necessary. 
Your goods will receive the proper handling in loading, packing and unloading to give you full profit, 

full confidence. 
They offer you the best in motor service, if it has to go, let Sue & Son Trucking take it. 
They extend wishes to all for the Happiest of Holidays. 

Brush Plumbing 
Brush Plumbing located in Slaton, phone 828-6360. 
Superior to the vast majority of plumbing and heating shops, and surpassed by none, either in general 

excellence of work or superiority of material used. 
This popular firm has continued its successful career for many years because the management and 

assistants are among the most efficient plumbing and heating craftsmen in this part of the state. 
If you.are figuring on any work, let them help you make up your plans. 
You will find that your consultation there will save you money. 
Brush Plumbing has gained an excellent reputation for giving prompt and courteous attention to every 

job. 
In this Review, we are glad to compliment them and to refer them to all of our readers when desiring 

work or information in this line. 
Happy Holidays to everyone. 

Western Seed & Delinting Co. 
DEPENDABILITY and Western Seed & Delinting Co., go hand in hand, a fact well recognized in this 

area. 
Located East of Tahoka on Highway 280, phone 998-4115 and in Lamesa, Highway 87 North, phone 

872-5388. 
This excellent firm offers a very wide service. 
They have been serving this area for many years. 
They feature cotton planting seed and offer acid delinting. 
They are there when you need them and will be happy to be of service to you. 
They are knowledgeable in their line of business and have the experience that enables them to serve 

their customers better. 
We are fortunate to have this reliable concern in our area and suggest you patronize them often. 
Merry Christmas and Happy New Year. 

1 

Grassland Butane Co. 
Rural residents will be pleased to know that Grassland Butane Co., is the authorized distributor of L.P. 

Gas in both bottled and bulk forms. 
This friendly concern specializes in personalized service and regular deliveries to the surrounding area. 
You won't be without the clean warmth of gas with this reliable company on the job. 
Located in Grassland, phone 327-5448. 
This is one fuel company which realizes the importance of keeping the customer satisfied. 
Whether you're a small or large user of L.P. Gas, Gtassland Butane Co., will do the utmost to keep you 

satisified. 
They value their customers above all else and their record of dependability shows it. 
The owners and the management wish to extend best wishes for a Merry Christmas and Happy New 

Year. 

Bownds Body Shop 
Located in Slaton at 1000 S. 9th, phone 828-6447. 
Give your car a new paint job. They have extensive equipment and wide experience in auto painting. 
This firm is also noted for its excellent work in repairing damaged cars. 
For many miles around, experienced motorists and garage men have learned to call upon this concern 

for service on wrecked cars. 
In many cases they have completely restored wrecked cars which the owners thought were beyond the 

aid of even expert service. 
A small scratch on your car can be taken care of in just a few minutes. 
A bent fender or crushed body can be replaced in very short order. 
The policy of this establishment is to employ only the most competent men. 
Do not fail to call when your car is in need of repair or for an expert paint job. 
The Bownds Family wishes all the warmest of Season's Greetings. 

R & S Auto Parts 
R & S Auto Parts is located at 136 W. Garza in Slaton, phone 828-6205. 
This firm means ECONOMY to the automobile owner of today. 
They have everything in the way of automobile parts which means a savings to the people of this area 

as their prices are the lowest. 
This economy is made possible because of the large amount of business they transact and they pass the 

savings on to their customers. 
We are pleased to give this public spirited and progressive concern mention in this Review issue and to 

say that whenever you are in need of automobile parts, you will find them at this firm. 
You can be assured of a SQUARE DEAL at all times and quality parts with every purchase. 
This firm also has farm, automobile and welding supplies. 
New parts sold at prices that cannot fail to appeal to anyone that uses an automobile. 
The owner and employees send wishes for a Merry Christmas and Happy New Year. 

Wilson State Bank 
Wilson State Bank is located in Wilson, phone 628-6551, and has long been recognized as one of the 

outstanding banks in our area. 
This Bank maintains the understanding and personal interest in each customer to cope with their 

particular problems. 
They are interested in the small depositor and the small loan applicants as well as the larger accounts. 
A great amount of praise is due the officers and directors, for they have contributed to the strength of 

our area's economic structure. 
Each depositor is insured up to $100,000 by the F.D.I.C. and has encouraged each and every family to 

help secure their future with a sound savings plan. 
The Board and members of the staff wishes all in the area a Merry Christmas and a Happy New Year. 

First National Bank of Tahoka 
The modern concept of present day banking includes dignified yet friendly customer relationship 

creating good will, success in business, and better living. 
Nowhere is this better exemplified than at The First National Bank of Tahoka in Tahoka at 1601 S. 1st, 

phone 998-4211. 
The policies of this bank represent the soundest of banking and business principles. 
Each depositor is insured up to $100,000 by F.D.I.C. 
The officers of this bank have the faith and confidence of their patrons because they have proven 

themselves a stalwart and interested friends to all their customers. 
This fine banking institution welcomes the accounts of people whose business can profit by sound 

banking connections. 
The officers and employees wish all a Happy Holiday Season. 

Farmer's Co-op Compress 
The Farmer's Co-op Compress at 3800 Southeast Drive in Lubbock, phone 763-9431, has served the 

farmers of our area faithfully and honestly for years. 
Managed by Rex McKinney, this fine cotton compress is capably operated, placing the welfare of the 

customer above all else. 
Honest, weights, efficient handling, and modern methods combine to result in the best and fastest 

service for the cotton producer. 
The care of your cotton can best be handled by this experienced firm. 
Through their expert service to the cotton industry, your profits will grow. 
We commend the management of this excellent company for their great contribution to the cotton 

industry and for maintaining stabilized prices for the benefits of the cotton producer. Merry Christmas & 
Happy New Year from 

Chance's Electrical 
Service 

Hwy 83 FM 100 Slaton 
Phone 828-6508 

• 24-HR. 	• 2-WAY RADIO 
SERVICE 	EQUIPPED 

• FULLY 
INSURED 

It 0 R 
.%• 

Ciairemont Hwy. 

CONCRETE 	
POST, TX. 79356 

Owens Co-op Gin 
The Owens Co-op Gin located S.E. of Rails in The Owens Community, phone 649-7461. 
A cleaner cotton, efficiently ginned by modern methods is the product of this gin. 
Their equipment is of ;the best obtainable, which accounts for the efficient operation they are noted for. 
You may take your cotton to this gin and be assured of rapid and satisfactory service. 
The management and employees are experts in the business and are prepared to take care of any amount 

of cotton in a relatively short time. 
With the excellent business judgment that has characterized the management's career, they realized that 

it was important that people of this community have an establishment of this kind they could depend on. 
The Town & Country Review, recommends Owens Co-op Gin to all in the area. 
The management and employees wish all the Happiest Holiday Season and a Healthy New Year. V. 0. RASBURY 
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Ph. (806) 495-3800 
(806) 495-3817 

Wilson Surveying 
Company Inc. 

1716 Ave M 
Lubbock 

Phone 763-3388 
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Phillips Ready Built 
Homes 

2306 Erskine 
Lubbock 

Phone 747-9133 

C.R. Anthony Co. of 
Slaton 

Slaton Plaza, Slaton 
Phone 828-6589 

R.E. Janes Gravel Co. 
East of Slaton 

Phone 828-6203 

BAILEY'S Tire Service 
2412 Huffman St. 

Snyder 
Phone 573-0213 

"Name That Sponsor 
Contest" 

C & M Supply Co. 
802 46th 

One block east of Ave H 
Lubbock 

Phone 747-5264 

SOUND CONCEPT 
3607 College Ave 

Snyder 
Phone 573-3421 

Listen and Win! 

with the KPOS 
* 

* 
* 

WIN CASH - WIN PRIZES! 

Listen to KPOS 

Hospital News 
December 3 - Mary Ault, dis-

missed. 
December 4 - Deanna Babb, * 

admitted. 
Baby Boy Babb, admitted. 
Janie Perez, admitted. 
December 5 - Baby Girl Perez, 

admitted. 

ti-****************44ft• 

* 
* 
* 
* 
* 
* 
* 
* 
* 
* 

* 	Get your Christmas going by winning prizes and 
* cash with the KPOS "Name That Sponsor Contest" * 

1370 AM 
Listen and win 

Carter-Adams Funeral Home 
Time and service have honored the name Carter-Adams Funeral Home located at 520 Watts in Rails, 

call 253-2174. 
For years, this reputable firm has served the people of this section. 
They relieve you of all worry and responsibility, and by sympathetic cooperation, bring comfort in the 

hour of distress. 
Their service supplies the consoling thought that the final tribute to your loved one has been beautiful 

and fitting. 
They have natural fitness for this profession as those they have served will testify. 
When the funeral director must be called, may we suggest that you place Carter-Adams Funeral Home 

in charge? 
You will find their services priced to fit your individual needs. 
In this Review, we unhesitatingly refer our readers to this reliable firm and suggest that you call them 

when in need of a funeral director. 
The owners wish to all a Merry Christmas and healthy New Year. 

Heritage Furniture 
YOUR HEADQUARTERS for furniture and appliances in Tahoka is Heritage Furniture at 1452 Ave. 

J., phone 998-5513. 
Here you will find furniture for the entire home as well as all the latest models in home appliances. 
Their furnishings can be found in many of the home in our area, unassailable proof of their fair and 

honest dealings, as well as their reasonable prices. 
Their stock is complete with nationally advertised name brands such as Riverside, Stratto Lounger, 

Broyhill and Maytag. 
They also feature an outstanding carpet and rug department composed of carpet from the leading 

manufacturers in the country. 
This fine store offers FREE DELIVERY on all its merchandise, with installation and service on all 

appliances. 
A good place to buy! 
Best wishes for the Happiest of Holidays. 

K-Mart Store # 9268 
Your K-Mart Store ft 9268 is located at 3500 College Ave. in Snyder, phone 915-573-4021. 
This is your discount shopping center as well as headquarters for housewares, paint, auto parts, 

appliances, cameras, clothing, notions, toys, furniture, and hundreds of additional items at DISCOUNT 
PRICES. 

This is also SPORTING GOODS HEADQUARTERS, will all those hard-to-find items in stock for 
your shopping convenience. 

Everything is displayed for your easy comparison and quick selection at this fabulous store. 
You will enjoy visiting K-Mart where courtesy and friendliness prevail and the prices are LOW, saving 

you money. 
We highly recommend to all our readers this fine shopping center. 
The manager and employees wish all "A Happy Holiday Season." 

Wayland Taylor Inc. 
Wayland Taylor Inc. located in O'Donnell at 815 9th, phone 806-428-3245, is the dealer for the popular 

John Deere Farm Equipment. 
Be sure you see this firm before you purchase your farm equipment. 
They have had years of experience in furnishing just the right machine for the job. 
When you buy farm equipment you want to know that you are getting machines that will stand up to the 

job. 
John Deere have stood the test for years. 
This equipment can be depended upon to give the maximum service per dollar invested. 
We wish to point to the fine reputation they have built. 
They are noted for square dealings and will stand behind every purchase. 
Trade with a firm you can depend upon and this is the one! 
Wishing you the Happiest Holiday Season ever! 

December 6 - Deanna Babb, * 
dismissed. 

Baby Boy Babb, dismissed. 	* 
Janie Perez, dismissed. 
Baby Girl Perez, dismissed. 
December 7 - Guadalupe Perez, * 

dismissed. 

KPOS 
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C-3 Apartments 

For rent - 3 room furnished apt 
$250.00 per month - also fur-
nished bedroom with private bath 
$150.00 - bills paid. 109 North 
Avenue N. - Post - call 495-4151 
or 1-799-0505. 

For rent or sale - 2 bedroom 
house and 2 apartments. 116 N. 
Ave. S. Call 915-573-6409. 
Raymond D. Wood. 

For rent - 3 room and shower apt. 
110 W. 6th - rear - call 495-2062 
or 797-2233. 

D-1 Mobile Home for Rent 

For rent - 2 bedroom, 1 bath mo-
bile home. Small family or cou-
ples only! 495-2211. 

D-3 Spaces for Rent 

Horseman's Dream 
Beautiful brick 3 bedroom, 2 bath, fireplace -
double garage - central heat and air - pool - 7 
stall barn almost new - another barn with arena. 
Approximately 5 acres - excellent fencing. 

Home for all Seasons 
The yard is breathtaking! 3 BR, 2 bath den, 
kitchen combination with fireplace. Separate 
dining and living room. You won't believe the 
storage. 

New Listings 
3 BR 2 bath central heat and air, corner lot - 
Good buy. 

3 BR 1 bath with carport, good conditilon and 
priced to sell. 

On New Lake Site 
7.44 acres and 3 bedroom home. Great for 
development on new lake. 

16 acres with home and barn - approximately 4 
miles west of Post. 

Lots of Lots 
We have several lots available in Arroyo 
Addition. 

Also 2 lots suitable for commercial use. 

Income property or good first home. 

2 bedroom, 1 bath. Good condition. 

Mitchell Real Estate 
Kim 	 Travis 

495-3719 	 495-2480 
Mike & Wanda 

495-3104 828-5878 

City County Drug and Alcohol 
Abuse Program, South Ave C, 
Postex Plant, 495-2818 or 495-
3788 - 24 hours. Glenda Baker, 
director; Lynette Warren, assis-
tant. 

A-13 Business Opportunites 

Open your own video store. Get 
started in the newest and most 
profitable business around! 
Featuring the latest releases from 
the major studios *Walt Disney 
*Warner Bros *RCA *Universal 
*20th Century Fox *Columbia 
and many more. Thousands of 
labels to choose from. For 
$31,900.00 to $51,900.00 you can 
have a complete store ready to 
service your first customer. Open 
in 10 to 15 days. Prestige Video-
Division of Prestige Fashions, 
501-329-8327. 

A-17 Services and Repairs 

D & J Small Motor Repair 
Specialize in lawn mowers and 
tillers. For information call 495-
2065. Joe Poe, Jr. Also have re-
conditioned lawn mowers for 
sale. 808 West 11th. 

Wall papering and painting. Call 
Eydie Dunn at 495-2097. 

Special 	occasion 	cakes. 
Birthday, 	anniversary 	or 
weddings. 	Call 	Jimella 
Simpson at 495-3318 after 5 
p.m. 

___ 

MARY KAY 
COSMETICS 

Call 
VADA CLARY 

in Post 
495-2582 

FOLLIS HEATING & 
AIR CONDITIONING 

Sales & Installation 
Service 

PAYNE EQUIPMENT 
FREE ESTIMATES 
Dial 628-6371 
Insured & Licensed 

Cook Bookkeeping 
and Tax Service 

Bookkeeping - Payroll - 
RRC Reports - Typing 

Income Tax Preparation 
Mrs Lois Cook 

owner and operator 
218 W. 8th 	495-2392 

G.H. (Jerry) Conoly 
Heating and Air 
Conditioning Co. 

Sales-Service-Installation 
Free Estimates Licensed by 

the State of Texas 
Fully Insured 

495-2950 or 
495-2332 

Special occasion parties video 
taped in your home. Call for ad-
ditional information or schedule 
appointments. 495-2818 (8-5) or 
495-3788 (after 5) 

'82 Ford 
2 door, coupe, white, very clean, one owner, low 
mileage, new tires. See and drive today. ONLY 

$3,15000  
'81 Thunderbird 

:4 2 door, air, power, tilt, cruise, auto, clean, great 
Tit color - bright red, locally owned. ONLY $0 

yc 05000 u 
4 

'82 Olds Cutlass 
4 door sedan, red cloth trim, vinyl roof, plenty of 
useful equipment, good tires, wire wheel covers, 
economy V-8 engine. Much more. ONLY 

$4,49500 

Well Number 5W. The proposed 
injection well is located 5 miles 
Northeast from Justiceburg in the 
Post (Glorieta) Field, in Garza 
County. Fluid will be injected into 
strata in the subsurface depth 
interval from 2510 to 2566 feet. 
Legal Authority: Chapter 27 of 
the Texas Water Code, as 
amended, Title 3 of the Natural 
Resources Code, as amended, and 
the Statewide Rules of the Oil and 
Gas Division of the Railroad 
Commission of Texas. 
Request for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are 
adversely affected, or requests for 
further information concerning 
any aspect of the application 
should be submitted in writing 
within fifteen days of publication, 
to the Underground Injection 
Control Section, Oil and Gas 
Division, Railroad Commission of 
Texas, Drawer 12967, Capitol 
Station, Austin, Texas 78711 
(Telephone 512/445/1373). 

Notice of Application for Fluid 
Injection Well Permit 

Wheeler Oil Company, 2010 
Texas American Bank Building, 
Fort Worth, Texas 76102 	has 
applied to the Railroad 
Commission of Texas for a permit 
to inject fluid into a formation 
which is productive of oil or gas. 
The applicant proposes to inject 
fluid into the Glorieta, W.V. Roy, 
Well Number 1W. The proposed 
injection well is located 5 miles 
Northeast from Justiceburg in the 
Post (Glorieta) Field, in Garza 
County. Fluid will be injected into 
strata in the subsurface depth 
interval from 2541 to 2580 feet. 
Legal Authority: Chapter 27 of 
the Texas Water Code, as 
amended, Tide 3 of the Natural 
Resources Code, as amended, and 
the Statewide Rules of the Oil and 
Gas Division of the Railroad 
Commission of Texas. 
Request for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are 
adversely affected, or requests for 

- further information concerning 
any aspect of the application 
should be submitted in writing 
within fifteen days of publication, 
to the Underground Injection 
Control Section, Oil and Gas 
Division, Railroad Commission of 
Texas, Drawer 12967, Capitol 
Station, Austin, Texas 78711 
(Telephone 512/445/1373). 

The Activity Dept. at Medlin 
Twin Cedar Nuring Home wish to 
thank everyone for the help in our 
candy sale earlier in the year to 
raise money for our lawn 
furniture. The Activity Dept. has 
agreed to let our volunteers Lola 
Ledbetter and Ruby Carpenter 
make the purchase of the lawn 
furniture. Marlin Young, our 
administrator, has put the money 
on deposit in the Medlin Twin 
Cedar account at the First 
National Bank. Purchase will be 
made as soon as the money is 
released to our volunteers to do 
so. I am quitting at this time and 
want to thank eveyone for their 
help since I've been Activity 
Director at the home. I couldn't 
have done it without any of you. 
ank you very much. 
Lanora Ellenberger 

A-9 Personals 

Alcohol-Drug 
Awareness Seminar Mondays - 8 
p.m. Postex Plan (east entrance) 
Open Group Discussion and 
films, public invited. 

Notice of Application for Fluid 
Injection Well Permit 

West Texas Petroleum, P.O. Box 
1403, Snyder, Texas 79549 has 
applied to the Railroad 
Commission of Texas for a permit 
to inject fluid into a formation 
which is productive of oil or gas. 
The applicant proposes to inject 
fluid into the Glorieta, Post-
Montgomery "C", Well Number 
10. The proposed injection well is 
located 7 miles NE of Post in the 
H&L Field, in Garza County. 
Fluid will be injected into strata 
in the subsurface depth interval 
from 3193 to 3387 feet_ 
Legal Authority: Chapter 27 of 
the Texas Water Code, as 
amended, Title 3 of the Natural 
Resources Code, as amended, and 
the Statewide Rules of the Oil and 
Gas Division of the Railroad 
Commission of Texas. 
Request for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are 
adversely affected, or requests for 
further information concerning 
any aspect of the application 
should be submitted in writing 
within fifteen days of publication, 
to the Underground Injection 
Control Section, Oil and Gas 
Division, Railroad Commission of 
Texas, Drawer 12967, Capitol 
Station, Austin, Texas 78711 
(Telephone 512/445/1373). 

A-3 Card of Thanks 

We say "Thank You" to all of you 
that helped make our anniversary 
such a happy occasion. It was 
such a fun time and we appreciate 
all that shared their time with us, 
the many beautiful cards we 
received, the phone calls and the 
gifts. May God bless you all. 
Barrie & Evelyn Jones 

PRIVATE PARTY 
Classified Rates 

10 cents per word & $2 mini-
mum. 

PAYABLE IN ADVANCE 
ALL private party classified 

ads must be PAID IN 
ADVANCE 

Each multiple run is one-half 
of the original price per each 
additional run after the first 
run. 

Eulogies and card of thanks 
for death in a family, up to 50 
words free, limit one insertion 
per family death. 

This rate is for private party, 
non-commerical, 	non-profit 
only, NO BUSINESSES at this 
rate. 

PAYABLE IN ADVANCE 
ONLY. ADVERTISEMENT 
WILL NOT RUN UNTIL 
PAYMENT IS RECEIVED. 

DEADLINE for copy and 
payment, Monday at 5 p.m. 

Corn merical Rates 
Established commerical and 

government units may be billed 
at the expiration of the adver-
tisement. 

Commerical and Legal Rate 
Number 	 Rate 
of Times 	 Per Line 
1 	 $1.55 
2 	  2.05 
3 	  2.55 
4 	  3.05 
5 	  3.55 
6 	  4.05 
7 	  435 

Legal Notice 
Notice is hereby given that the 
City of Post will receive 
proposals for insurance coverage 
on all city owned motor vehicles. 
Sealed bids are to be submitted 
prior to 5:00 p.m. January 5, 1987 
to the City Secretary at Post's 
City Hall, 105 East Math St., 
Post, Texas. The City reserves the 
right to reject any and all 
proposals and to waive 
formalities. 
W.G. Pool, Jr. 
City Manager 

Notice of Application for Fluid 
Injection Well Permit 

Wheeler Oil Company, 2010 
Texas American Bank Building, 
Fort Worth, Texas 76102 	has 
applied to the Railroad 
Commission of Texas for a permit 
to inject fluid into a formation 
which is productive of oil or gas. 
The applicant proposes to inject 
fluid into the Glorieta, W.V. Roy, 
Well Number 7W. The proposed 
injection well is located 5 miles 
Northeast from Justiceburg in the 
Post (Glorieta) Field, in Garza 
County. Fluid will be injected into 
strata in the subsurface depth 
interval from 2538 to 2578 feet. 
Legal Authority: Chapter 27 of 
the Texas Water Code, as 
amended, Title 3 of the Natural 
Resources Code, as amended, and 
the Statewide Rules of the Oil and 
Gas Division of the Railroad 
Commission of Texas. 
Request for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are 
adversely affected, or requests for 
further information concerning 
any aspect of the application 
should be submitted in writing 
within fifteen days of publication, 
to the Underground Injection 
Control Section, Oil and Gas 
Division, Railroad Commission of 
Texas, Drawer 12967, Capitol 
Station, Austin, Texas 78711 
(Telephone 512/445/1373). 

Notice of Application for Fluid 
Injection Well Permit 

Wheeler Oil Company, 2010 
Texas American Bank Building, 
Fort Worth, Texas 76102 	has 
applied to the Railroad 
Commission of Texas for a permit 
to inject fluid into a formation 
which is productive of oil or gas. 
The applicant proposes to inject 
fluid into the Glorieta, W.V. Roy, 

A-1 Legal Notice 

Notice of Application for Fluid 
Injection Well Permit 

RiD Management Company, Inc., 
P.O. Box 2130, Lubbock, Texas 
79408-2130 has applied to the 
Railroad Commission of Texas 
for a permit to inject fluid into a 
formation which is productive of 
oil or gas. The applicant proposes 
to inject fluid into the San 
Andres, Northwest Garza Unit, 
Well Number 709-T. The 
proposed injection well is located 
3 1/2 miles Northwest of Post, 
Texas in the Garza Field, in Garza 
County. Fluid will be injected into 
strata in the subsurface depth 
interval from 3150 to 3450 feet. 
Legal Authority: Chapter 27 of 
the Texas Water Code, as 
amended, Title 3 of the Natural 
Resources Code, as amended, and 
the Statewide Rules of the Oil and 
Gas Division of the Railroad 
Commission of Texas. 
Request for a public hearing from 
persons who can show they are 
adversely affected, or requests for 
further information concerning 
any aspect of the application 
should be submitted in writing 
within fifteen days of publication, 
to the Underground Injection 
Control Section, Oil and Gas 
Division, Railroad Commission of 
Texas, Drawer 12967, Capitol 
Station, Austin, Texas 78711 
(Telephone 512/445/1373). 
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Three refrigerators for sale in 
very good shape. One like new, 
priced cheap. Come by 615 W. 
3rd anytime or call 495-3977. 

Ps 	Page 12 The Post Dispatch Wed., December 10, 1986 FREE puppies just in time for 
Christmas - six males, one female 
- 1/2 Labradao Reviver, 1/2 
"surprise". 495-2077. 

B-3 Jobs Wanted 

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING If you need ironing done, then 
come by 916 West 6th after 5 
p.m. and talk to Becky. The cost 
is really reasonable - only $3.75 
per dozen. 

F-3 Garage Sale 
F-11 Feed and Seed 

Garage Sale - 309 N. Ave. I. 
Thursday and Friday, 9-5. For sale - Alfalfa hay - Tahoka. 

Lynn Cook - 998-4115. 
I do monogramming - call Linda 
Davis at 495-3442. Sweatshirts, 
towels, etc. Have your Christmas 
items personally monogrammed. 

Garage sale - coast, suits, dresses, 
shirts, pants, jeans, fashion shoes, 
blouses, drapes, light fixtures and 
pot plants. 119 N. Ave. S., 
Thursday and Friday, 8-5. 
F-7 Pets and Supplies C-1 Homes for Rent 

Baby rabbits for sale - $3 each. 
Go by 808 West 11th or call 495-
2065. 

For rent - 2 bedroom, natural gas, 
electricity - in Pleasant Valley. 
495-2549. 

Vinegar is a natural mea 
tenderizer. 

IIIISSSSMAISATSAIIISSIPSAISSAISMAPFA 

Seals Furniture & Appliance k 
508 S. Ave. N 

495-3190 
Come on by and take a look - we have a 

little bit of everything. 

Sign up for a turkey to be given away on 
December 23. 

Lots of garage sale items - New and used 
dinette sets - used stereos and televisions - 

heaters (gas and electric) - new and used 
living room suites. 

Refrigerators - Freezers 
Washers and dryers  

Clocks - Knives  
Used Barcoloungers and lots more. 

We stock parts for washers and dryers and 
do service work on washers and dryers. 

Owner - James L. Seals 
Manager - Oleain Seals 

For rent - 1 trailer space at 514 
W. 14th. Call 629-4355 or 495- 
3066. 	 • 
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E-1 Homes for Sale 

House located at 305 North 
Avenue H (Lot 11, Block 50), 
Post, Garza County, Texas. 
Contact Jack Alexander, First 
National Bank - 495-2804. 

For sale - 3 bedroom, 2 bath brick 
home, fireplace, central heat and 
air. 302 Osage - call 495-3225 or 
652-3355. 

Two, 3 bedroom houses, 1 bath, 
near schools, 1 is less than 500 ft_ 
from Jr. High. 1 is less than 100 ft 
from High School. Call if inter-
ested in buying Homer Gordon, 
495-2287.Also for sale, a 28 ft 
travel trailer. 

Priced to sell - 3 bedroom house, 
1 1/2 baths, carport, fireplace, 
fenced yard. Call after 5 p.m. at 
495-3872 or 495-3637. 906 W. 
12th. Over 1300 sq. ft. Shown by 
appointment only. 

F-1 Miscellaneous for Sale 

For Sale - boys Post Antelope 
jacket (size 18). In very good 
condition. See at Post Dispatch -
$20. Becky Warren. 
For sale - 28' travel trailer, 1973, 
self-contained, $1,700. Call 495-
2138.  
For sale - beautiful regulation 8 ft 
pool table, wood/chocolate 
brown, 1/2" slate with pool light 
and all accessories. 495-3615. 

For Sale: DP Gympac 1000 wall 
unit weights and bench. $150. 
Call 495-3087. 

B-1 Help Wanted For Sale: Twin bed with bookcase 
headboard, box springs and 
mattress, good condition and 
reasonably priced. 495-3442. 

Help Wanted - Male or female - 
Caprock Vetemiary Hospital - full 
or part-time. Apply in person. 

te..4rinterier...aaseraftiarieter.,,Werattranr..41,401friaanatnian vraiitrat SS" 

December Sale 
'84 Mustang 
Only 23,000 miles, 
cylinder, turbo, air, 
believe. 

leather seats, 5 speed, 4 
many more extras. See to 

$7,9500o 

'79 GMC Crew Cab 
350 engine, air, 3/4 ton, very clean. Fiber glass 
camper carpeted, lighted and seating. Very nice, 
drive today. ONLY $4,15000  
'79 Blazer 
400 small block engine, auto, air , 4 wheel drive, 
like new tires, AM radio, clean, ready for the 
road. Drive today . ONLY $

‘#
0, 

 , • ‘• 
7=000 

'79 Olds Cutlass Station Wagon 
Automatic, power seats, locks, luggage rack, 
sluper wheels, AM/FM tape radio. Tan, clean, 
one owner. 
$495 down, 12 payments of $100 each, APR 
14%, Tax, title tags included. ONLY 

'80 GMC 
1/2 ton pickup, long-wide model, 350 engine, air, 
power, stereo, radio, good tires. ONLY $3575000 

'13/4  

495-2825 

'81 Buick Regal 
2 door Landau, white padded top and red lower 
body. Locking wheel covers, tilt, cruise, economy 
V6 engine. Tape deck radio and much more. 
Low mileage for the model, clean ONLY $700 
down, balance of 24 payments of $160 each, TTT 
fees not included. APR 14 %. 

$1,4450° 
Special of the Week 

'70 Olds Sedan 98 
Power seats, most accessories work. Runs fair. 
Cash price ONLY $29500 

lk 
lk 

111 S Broadway 

See these fine used units at 

Vyas Motors, Inc. 
satessAtairs-AorannatorattraorrAgrArnradirAirArisradiririaraieraleArAradrAirAir  
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Owen of this city. Mrs Owen is the 
former Edna Mac Pierce. The baby 
was born at the home of Mrs 
Owen's parents. Mr and Mrs T.A. 
Pierce. The boy was named Ben L., 
Jr. 

The average lawn is home 
to over 100 species of in-
sects and other inverte-
brate animals, such as 
snails, mites, spiders and 
earthworms. 

As gleaned from the files of 
The Post Dispatch, courtesy of the 
Post Public Library microfilm 
service. 

by Becky Warren 
10 Years Ago 

December 9, 1976 
Garza's 1976 cotton crop 

appears is shaping up as the second 
best in the county's history 
"dollarwise." 

For the seventh straight year, 
Garza County's annual United 
Fund Drive has reached and 
exceeded it's goal. 

Three major issues will face the 
Texas Legislature in January 
according to State Senator Kent 
Hance who came to Post 
Wednesday on a final swing 
around the district before the 
session opens. 

The biggest news about the city 
council meeting Monday night was 
that it was one of the shortest in 
months. 

A Garza County district court 
jury panel was notified not to 
report Monday when the cases set 
for trial either were continued or 
resulted in guilty pleas being 
entered. 

Post Public Library patrons 
checked out 760 books during 
November, according to Librarian 
Pee Wee Pierce's monthly report 
this week. 

Everette Windham, Dee Caffey 
and Loyd Mock, employees of 
George R. Brown, were recently 
honored by the company for 25 
years of service and were presented 
service awards. 

Trustees of the Post Public 
Library decided at their December 
meeting last Thursday morning to 
cut back their book buying early in 

PRICE WAR! Half price! 
Flashing arrow signs $289! 
Lighted, non-arrow $279! 
Unlighted $239! Free letters! 
See locally. Factory: 1(800) 
423-0163, anytime. 

All entries must be on the printed form in The Post Dispatch, I 
facimiles or photo reproduced copies of the newspaper form are 
ineligible. 

The tie-breaker will only be used in case there is a tie between 
contestants on the total number of correct selections in the I 
contest. 

Name 	  

Address 	  

Phone 	  

linanonava annennell 

HUDMAN FUNERAL HOME 
615 West Main 	 495-2821 

NEED STORAGE SPACE?? 
(Pest Control Used) 

120 sq. ft of Storage Space. (10' ?C 12') 
Only 835 Per Month 

Plus $15'Refundable_Deposit- 

Sue Little - Omega Properties 
495-37°4  

CITY OF POST 
STATEMENT OF INCOME AND EXPENDITURES 
FOR THE YEAR ENDED SEPTEMBER 30, 	1986 

Income 

183,193 
168,484 
321,727 

Ad Valorem Tax 
Sales 	Tax 
Other Taxes 
Water & Sewer Sales & Services 255,064 
Fees, 	Permits 	& Services 77,238 
Revenue Sharing 44,066 
Fines 47,385 
Interest 	Income 44,737 
Royalties 52,721 
Grants 197,842 
Other Income 47,850 

Total 	Income 

Expenditures by Department 

1,440,307 

Administration 220,929 
Police and Court 199,806 
Fire 49,327 
Street 162,265 
Sanitation 82,114 
Cemetary 23,385 
Park 34,613 
Li bra ry 25,244 
Health Officer 850 
Airport 7,260 
Ambulance 15,043 
Purchase of Fixed Assets 155,426 
Lease 	Principal 8,384 
Water Purchased 72,600 
Water Distribution 131,138 
Sewage 9,919 
Grant 	Expenditures 178,340 
IMHOFF & Lagoon Maintenance 4,201 
SPEMS 1,250 
Other 34,412 

Total Expenditures 

Net Income (Loss) 

1,416,506 

23,801 

Classifieds 
F-21 Wanted to Buy sq Yesteryears 
Fur Buyer 
Doug Stout, Fur Buyer, will be in 
Post at Gin Yard each Friday 
from 9 a.m. - 9:45 a.m. beginning 
December 5. For more informa-
tion call 817-647-1906 

G-1 Motorcycles 

Yamaha Virago - 1400 actual 
miles - perfect condition - many 
extras - $1,850.00 - call 495-
2077. 

G-7 Trucks For Sale 

For sale - 1972 Dodge pickup - 4 
wheel drive - $875. Call 495-2015 
or 495-3468 (after 5 p.m.) 

1982 Chevy Pickup - 4 wheel 
drive - contact 1st National Bank 
- 495-2804. 

Due to the illness of County 
Judge Pat N. Walker, who 
underwent surgery this week in 
Garza Memorial Hospital, the 
session of county court scheduled 
for Monday has been postponed, 
County Attorney Carlton P. Webb 
said Wednesday. 

Mrs C.R. Thaxton, who was 
injured in an automobile accident 
near Lubbock on November 23, 
has been returned to her home here 
from West Texas Hospital. 

The club's project to place 
trash containers on Main Street 
was the principal topic at Monday 
night's meeting of the Post Junior 
Chamber of Commerce, held in the 
school lunchroom. 

A trophy case, made possible 
through a $50 donation from the 
1956 graduating class, was 
installed Tuesday in the hallway at 
Post High School. The trophy case 
was constructed by four of this 
year's shop students, James 
Williams, Troy Cartmill, Sammy 
Martin and Arlon Ford. 

40 Years Ago 
December 12, 1946 

County Judge J. .Lee Bowen 
and 	Ernest 	Henderson, 
commissioner of Precinct 1, joined 
county judges and commissioners, 
representing counties along a 
proposed new highway, Tuesday 
morning in Austin in submitting 
the project to the State Highway 
Commission for designation. The 
proposed highway "Broadway to 
the Big Bend," when completed 
would form an international and 
transcontinental 	highway 
stretching from Canada through the 
United States, and the Republic of 
Mexico to the Pacific Ocean. 

Two of the three Post jail-
breakers, who escaped here 
November 5, were meted out 
penitentiary sentences Monday 
afternoon by a Garza County jury 
when they were tried in 106th 
district court on charges of robbery 
which grew out of the escape they 
made from the Post jail after 
slugging Deputy Sheriff "Pop" 
Galyean and robbing him of his 
cash and stealing his automobile to 
make their getaway. 

Remodeling of the 40x160 foot 
building on Main, which formerly 
housed the M.J. Malouf dry goods 
store, and which will be occupied 
after the first of January by the 
G.T. Wacker variety store, got 
underway the first of the week. 

With only ten more shopping 
days remaining 'til Christmas, Post 
merchants and dealers have been as 
busy as bees the past few days 
making ready for the holiday rush 
which is sure to come the last few 
days before Christmas. 

Pupils of Mrs J. A. Stallings are 
to be presented in recital at the 
High School auditorium on Friday 
night, December 13 at 7:45 
o'clock. 

A son weighing eight and a half 
pounds was born at 6:15 Saturday 
afternoon to Mr and Mrs Ben L. 

FOOTBALL CONTEST 
Deadline Fridays 4 P.M. 

FIRST PRIZE $10 

SECOND PRIZE $5 

G-9 Autos for Sale 
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1977 Oldsmobile 98 - clean, good 
motor, good transmission, good 
tires. S750. Call 495-2240. 

Please circle the team you think will win 

Hurst Bell vs Plano 
LaMarque vs Austin Reagan 

McKinney vs Hereford 
New Braunfels vs West Orange-Stark 

Jefferson vs Lampasas 
Cuero vs Port Arthur Austin 

Reagan County vs Mart 
Shiner vs Winona 

Wheeler vs Throckmorton 
Bremond vs Burkeville 

Fort Hancock vs Christoval 
Buffalo at Indianapolis 
Cleveland at Cincinnati 

Green Bay at Tampa Bay 
New Orleans at Atlanta 
Philadelphia at Dallas 
St Louis at NY Giants 

San Francisco at New England 
Kansas City at LA Raiders 

Miami at LA Rams 
Minnesota at Houston 
Seattle at San Diego 

tie-breaker 
Seattle at San Diego 

Higginbotham-Bartlett 

Garza Auto 

Caprock Golf Course 

United Supermarket 

South Plains Answering Service 

South Plains Welding 

First National Bank 

Ammons Printing 
& Office Supplies 

it3 

1977 and purchase some needed 
additional shelving. 

As has been its custom for 
many years, The Dispatch will 
publish letters to Santa Claus in its 
final two issues before Christmas. 

20 Years Ago 
December 8, 1966 

Mrs A.C. Surman was named 
one of the state's 20 outstanding 
county historical survey committee 
chairmen at the state meeting in 
Fort Worth last week. The Garza 
County committee received three 
awards at the meeting. 

Post's second Christmas Cash 
Discount night will be held in nine 
local stores here Friday night with 
prices cut 10 percent on all cash 
purchases. 

Eight civil cases have been set 
for jury trial in Garza County 
district court here next week before 
Judge Truett Smith, beginning at 
10 a.m. Monday. 

Garza County's 1967 United 
Fund drive went "over the top" this 
week with a total of $8,244 in cash 
and pledges already in. The goal is 
$8,200. 

Fifteen bales of cotton and 
seven trailers were destroyed by 
fire about 1 an. last Friday at the 
Basinger Gin in Southland. 

Loyd Mock was re-elected fire 
chief and Neal Clary was elected 
President of the Post Volunteer 
Fire Department at Monday night's 
meeting. 

Jerry Hitt, talented young Post 
pianist and vocalist who is making 
quite a name for himself in the 
Texas entertainment world, has just 
had his second record released. 

Syd Conner gave Post 
Rotarians a short talk in support of 
the Christmas Seal drive conducted 
by the West Texas Tuberculosis 
Association at their weekly 
luncheon Tuesday. 

The Post Volunteer Fire 
Department's bill for December 1, 
1965, to December I, 1966, turned 
in to the city council Monday 
night, totals $4,107, as compared 
with last year's bill of $4,168. 

30 Years Ago 
December 13, 1956 

By a vote of 110 to 5 Tuesday, 
Garza County farmers joined the 
nation's other cotton growers in 
giving overwhelming approval to 
the national cotton marketing quota 
program. 

Funeral services for W.R. 
Young, who died about 5:15 a.m. 
Saturday at Lubbock Methodist 
Hospital, were conducted at 2:30 
o'clock Monday afternoon in the 
Church of Christ. 

A Christmas toy matinee, 
sponsored by Girl Scout Troop 1 
and 27 Post business firms, will be 
held at 9:30 o'clock Saturday 
morning at the Tower Theatre. 

3 BR, 2 bath brick, reduced to 
$37,500. Income property, 
house and trailer space -
$15,800. Travis Ellis, 495-
2480. Vt 

Furs Unlimited 

WANTED 
Coon, coyote, opossum, fox, 

badgers, bobcats and 
unskinned skunks. 

Fur buyer will be in Post 
beginning December 6 at 

Martin's Restaurant from 
11:25 a.m. to 12 p.m. each 

Saturday throughout the fur 
season. 

Furs Unlimited 
Box 291 

Cross Plains, Tx 76443 
(817)725-7350 

We Buy Rattle Snakes  
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McMeans, Davis, Jones Graduate 
education was awarded to 
Teresa Diane Cartmill 
McMeans. 

A Master's degree in en-
tomology was awarded to 
Leanna J. Davis. 

A Master's degree in 
speech communication was 
awarded to Billy Vance 
Jones. 

30 Yrs. Experience 

Brake Service 
	

Bear Wheel Alignment 

Minor Repairs 	State Inspection 

Wash & Service 	Wheel Balancing 

Garza Exxon 
4.9'.;-3031 
	

300 N. Broadway 	Johnie Johnson owner 

 

 

• Windshields • Residential Glass 
• Industrial Equipment Glass 

• Insurance Rebates 

   

  

CAPROCK GLASS CO. 
Volxie Setaa" 

Rt. 3 -:- POST, TEXAS 79356 

     

 

Ph. 495-3069 or 495-2702 
Mon. thru Sat. 

DELWIN FLUITT 
Owner 

   

  

COMMERCIAL INDUSTRIAL RESIDENTIAL 

   

  

CONSTRUCTION CONSULTANT  

    

 

PRELIMINARY LAYOUTS 	COST ANALYSIS 
NEW CONSTRUCTION 	WORKING DRAWINGS 
REMODELING 	OUTLINE SPECIFICATIONS 
FEASIBILITY STUDY OVERSEE CONSTRUCTION 

   

 

JOE HENSLEY 
3408-39TH ST. 

(806) 792-9297 
LUBBOCK, TX. 79413 
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Lowell Bryan 

Construction 

       

 

New Construction 
Cabinets 
Painting 
General Repairs 

Additions 
Remodeling 

Small Concrete Jobs 
Accent Walls 

  

  

Local References 
Free Estimates 

All Work Gauranteed 

      

   

Lowell Bryan 
495-4105 

       

            

            

            

More than 800 students at 
Texas Tech University com-
pleted degree requirements at 
the end of the 1986 summer 
session. 

Degree recipients in-
cluded the following from 
Post: 

A Bachelor's degree in 

Cantu Graduates 

from Air Force 
Pvt. 1st Class Freddie V. 

Cantu, son of Eddie M. 
Cantu of Post, Texas, has 
graduated from the U.S. Air 
Force television production 
course at Lowry Air Force 
Base, Colo. 

During the course, stu-
dents were taught camera 
operation and other facets of 
television production. 

They also earned credits 
toward an associate degree 
through the Community 
College of the Air Force. 

His grandparents, Mr and 
Mrs Manuel Vasquez, reside 
in Georgetown, Texas. 

Southland Menu 
December 15 - 19 
Monday, Dec 15 

Breakfast - Rice, sausage, 
juice, milk. 

Lunch - Chili beans, augratin 
potatoes, fried squash, cornbread. 

Tuesday, Dec 16 
Breakfast - Toast, bacon, juice, 

milk. 
Lunch - Steak fingers, cream 

potatoes with gravy, English peas, 
rolls, pudding. 

Wednesday, Dec 17 
Breakfast - Cream-o-wheat, 

orange half, juice, milk. 
Lunch - Barbecued chicken, 

corn on cob, tossed salad, roll, 
jello. 

Thursday, Dec 18 
Breakfast - Cinnamon toast, 

applesauce, juice, milk. 
Lunch - Lasagna, tossed salad, 

green beans, rolls, cake. 
Friday, Dec 19 

Breakfast - Cereal, toast, juice, 
milk. 

Lunch 	 Hamburger, 
hamburger salad, french fries, ice 
cream. 
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Oh, what fun it is 
to shop in Post City! 

Come see Santa Thursday night 
in Post from 6:30 to 8 p.m. 

Sign up for a $35 gift certificate to be given away Saturday 
and 
a $25 gift certificate to be given away Thursday night at 8 

All Ladies Blouses 

THURSDAY NIGHT ONLY 
from 6:30 - 8:30 

Twins Fashions 
210 E. Main 	Gift Wrapping Visa & MC 	495-3387 

Hudman 
Furniture 

301 E Main 

MC 	 495-2615 

* Jewelry 

* Sweaters 

* Belts 

* Shoes 

* Boots 

* Skirts 

* Tops 

Just in Time for Christmas 
NEW Shipment of Mom-O Jeans 
for Bali),  Boys & Girls 

Sizes 
0-3 Mo.  

Ladies 
Texsheen Briefs. 
In Christmas Colors 

$200 a pair Collectible series Keepsake Ornaments help you 
start a heartwarming family tradition. If your're 

already a collector, pass the tradition on to a friend 
by giving a Keepsake Ornament gift. 

New Selection of 
Girls Dresses 

Sizes 4-5-6-6x 

IA Twin Pack Flashlights 

✓ Cash Boxes 

I.- Children's Video Tapes 

Reg. $995 	Now $795  

Handy Hardware & Handy Gifts 
231 E. Main 495-3516 

Cologne for Ladies & Men 30% off Reg. Price 

Post Sweat Shirts Reg. 98" Sale $1330  
Thermal Underwear 30% Off Reg. Price 

Hanes Colored Briefs by Bill B ass 

Reg.$450 Sale $315  

The STITHL 011AVE0 
A Lot of Saw 

in a Little Package. 
This compact, lightweight saw 

offers many professional features 
like Stihl's heavy-duty, anti-vibration 

system, automatic chain oiling, a 
specially-impregnated, long-life 

cylinder and more. It's a lot more 
saw for the money. It's a Stihl. 

List 5 264 95  
011AVEQ 16" Bonus Pack 
with Carrying Case 	Special $21995  

thru 12-17-86 

Also Stock Stihl Bar & Engine Oil 

Little Boys Long Sleeve Pullover Shirts 
Reg. 58°° Sale $560  

Mens Jackets Reg. 52795  Sale $1960 

Girls Jeans Size 5-20 Values up to 536°° 

Now $1465  

Trends for Men and Family 
Downtown Post 
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