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HERO, VILLAIN AND HEROINE Shown left
to right, "Dashing Dan", Jim Wells, the hero;
the villain, "Pedro the Pancake Peddler," Jim
Jackson;and the heroine "Sweet Nell", Marita

'Gaper,spaghetti
to fee benefit fare
"The Great Post Toasties

Caper", a musical melo-
drama by Dr. Tom Pass,
will bepresentedby the Post
Music Club Friday and
Saturday nights, Nov. 4th
and 5th at the Post
Community Center, with
show time scl for B p.m.

Tickets arcnow on sale by
memberso'fMhe PdstMusic
Club-nn-d Posf Hlgrr-Schoo- l

Choir.pr may. t.purch'ateT
at the door.

A spaghetti supperwill be
servedboth nights at 7 p.m.

Bill Jones is
new deputy

GarzaCounty had another
new sheriff deputy on the
job Wednesday

He is Bill Jones, who
formerly was a night
patrolman for the city of
Paducnh. Jones is a certi-
fied officer with several
years of law enforcement
experience. He .s married
and the father of one small
child.

Sheriff Jim Pippin told
The Dispatchyesterdaythat
he had one opening still to
fill but had an applicant due
in for an Interview later
Wednesday.

McCrary namedto
review committee

Mayor Giles McCrary has
beenappointeda memberof
the'20-mcmbe-r South Plains
Health Systems Project
Review Committee

Marshall Formby. Plain
view attorney, has been
named chairman

The committee will meet
Nov. 22 in Lubbock to adopt
proceduresand criteria for
project review of federal
funds. The group also will
adopt procedures and cri-

teria for the review of new
institutional healthservices
which are subject to review
by the Texas Health Facili-

ties Commission.

After the dust had settled
nnd the injured carried mf.
the Post Powdor Puff
football game played last
Saturday night in Autulopc
Slndiiim av the "llHinlHirg-er'- s

Helpers" coaohed liy
Don Blluiibvrgtir dufoat the
VMIS Menu Machine". 34 to

7.

On I be opening klckoff
Shlrloy "Jbws" Josoyran It

all the way back for n td for
d total nt 01 yards Terry

by the choir with soft drinks
and snacksalso to be sold.

The melodrama includes
such names as Sweet Nell.
Dashing Dan. Pedro the
Pancake Peddler, the good
guys and the badguys, and
many other surprise cha-
racters.

Proceeds from the musi-
cal will bo used by both
gk!iL lr. Mr. various

Historical group
to meet Tuesday

The Garza Historical Sur
vey Committee will meet
Tuesday.Nov. 8 at 10 a m in

the bank community room
Special guests for the

meeting will be Hay Smith
and Geo-g- Barker

Mrs Ma xi ne Marks
chairman of the organ!
yatinn urgesall members to
attend the meeting

JF
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"The a melodrama
in be hpld in the community
Saturday -

k . 'JflttMH" it idS
"

PATRONS OF ALGERITA
are of the membersof the of

the melodrama Left to
Patterson, Jack

GUYS AND BAD GUYS left to from cast of "The
Post Caper", Rhodes, "Mr. Stumble," Dwayno

Capps. "Mr Gllmore. Whittle." Peel,
"Black Ray Bagby, Snort."

Helpers take Mean
Machineapart,37--0

"Pigskin" Patterson threw
"Atom Ant" Allen

extra points "Pigskin"
seoreil swoop
throw "Jawt"

Carol "Big Had"
Williams throw "Pigskin"

yards
othur touchdown

indite Trww "Wltw-nut- "

Woods
mily chuuhIIv

when tougli
dofoiHilve BlBiid

Jackson. three cast
Great Post Toasties Caper"

center Friday and
niqht (Staff Photo)

CAFE Shown
above some chorus

Post Music Club right
Tnnya Rudd Terry and Mary
Ann Gordon (Staff Photo)

GOOD Shown right,
Great Toasties Cletus

Spit," Terry "Mr. Lonnie Gene
Bart." and "Loud (Staff Photo)

Mine

Hamburger's Helpers"
saw ono of it's members.
DolorW "Close City Bomb-

er" Itedmau holped off the
field suffering a brulso.

Contributing to the spirit
ttf Hie game was attractive
ehoorlofldcrs Butch Booth.
f?rlk Howard. Chuck Basj.
dimly Klrkpfltrlck. Debbie
Wyll. KarcHi Perkins nnd
Sihmii Sftwyern

HRlf-ttm- e wilorlaliimoot
Sit Hetiim. Pogeil

T. C. Polk retires
from Continental
Talloy C. Polk. 302 V 13th

Street. Post retired Nov I

after more (han 34 years of
service with Continental Oil
Company He Is a mainte-
nance man for Conoco's
Ackorly-Pos- t production
arva.

A native of Dllllon. Tox..
Polk Joined Conoco's pro-
duction dopartmont as a
roustaboutfirst class In the
Northwiwt Gainos County
Hold In 1943. He became a
pumper In Iho Donvor City
production district in 10S7

and whs promoted to sonlor
lonse operator at Post in
tuflfl. He has boon malnte-tutttc-c

man since 1909

Garza's crop may

hit 26,000 bales
20,000 in

ginnings
According to glnners'

present estimates. Garza's
li77cottnn harvest,which In
most areas is moving into
the cleanup stage, is going
to Ik' considerably bigger
than most of the local
"experts"have predicted.

Wilh 19.721 bales already
ginned by Tuesdayafter-
noon and another 1.158
taggedout on the gin yards.
Gnrzn'R cotton crop had
moved past the 20.000 bale
mark.

dinners told The Dispatch
bv lelephniip they expect
another5.350 balesof Garza
rot Inn beforethey shut down
enrlv for the winter

If their estimates are
close that would put Garza's
cotton crop nt 2r.229 bales
about 5.000 balesabove-wha-t

some have figuredJhetntal
crop to be

Already twn gins havecut
hack from 24 hour opera-
tions to a single crew
becausetheycan seetheend
is near

Only nt Planters Gin here
in Post are gin operations
expected to extend beyond
Thanksgiving.

Planters reports only
about ono third of its area
harvest in with many
farmers waiting for a
freeze.

Graham Gin also has a

Rites are held

for infant
Graveside services were

held at Terrace Cemetery
Sunday. Oct 3fiat 3 p;m. for
Franque Michelle
Ciimmlngs. one month old
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.
I .iitv Cummlngs of Raw--i

t v n
The infant died Oct. 27 in

( hildrcns Hospital in Den-m-t

Colo.

Rev. Glenn Recce,pastor
of the First Baptist Church
officiated the services.

Survivors include her
parents,a sister.Tracy Linn
of the home, grandparents.
Mrs Maxine Cummings of

Post andMr and Mrs. John
Corey of Coldwater. Michi-

gan and also a r.

Mrs. R.L. Cum-

mings of Post.
Pallbearers were J O

CummlngsandWaller Ford
Interment was under the

direction of Mason Funeral
Home

Injured Lope

has operation
Steve Davis. Post senior

who was injured ) the first
quarter of the Denver City
game here Friday night,
underwent surgery in Uni-

versity Hospital in Lubbock
Tuesday morning on his
groin injury

Conch Jackie Brownd said
Davis was blocking on a
punt return when thekneeof
the Denver City plnyor he
was blocking caught him in
the groin in a froak
aendrnt

Davis is theson of Mr and
Mrs Grady Davis of Iho
Sioux Ixlge

Coach Brownd visited
briefly wilh Stevethat same
morning after his surgery
The Mirgery was reported to
be successfuland the youth
tn be Improving

Methodist to
hold reception

The First United Metho-
dist Church will host a
receptionfrom 2 to 3 p.m. in
the Community Center Sun-

day. Nov. 6. to honorseveral
membersof the church for
having served the church
faithfully for miuy years.

The Rev. Ab CockroJI.
former pastor, of Vernon
will be guest spoakeral the
church for the Sunday
morning worship sorvico

The public is invited to
attendworship servicesnnd
lite reception

was to go wilh 4.744 bales
tagged out of some 0.500
expected

Almost nil gins are well
abreast of I he harvests in
their area. Only at the
Grahamgin is there a ynrd
hneklog.

This is the gin by gin
report :

C,nil win Gin- - 4.010 tales
gltUtfUl, W4 more on ynrd.
about 0.500 total bales

POST'S HALLOWEEN FIRES

Organizedbut
unsuccessful
In Fire Chief Neol Clary s

opinion. Post boys had their
"best organizedHalloween"
in history here Monday
night, if not the most
successfulone.

The outhouse it's a
problem to evon find one
around these days was
truckedonto West Main and
set afire about 10:20 p. m. to
get things rolling.

The only thing was, the
fire had gone out evon
before the fire department
arrived

Thai's the reasonit could
not be termed a verv

Field of cotton burs

burning itself out
Strong north winds sent

huge plumes of mke
swirling into the skv from a
half mile long field of
burning .cotton burr near
the Grnhnm Coon Gim

Another Garza
oil field theft

Another Garza oil field
theft was reported over the
weekend

The George R Brown oil

Interests told the sheriffs
department a well head an
valves, worth approximate-
ly $400. were stolon from a
week site nbonl 3 miles
south of Post between
Sunday afternoon ami day-
light Monday.

Voters from six of Garza
nine voting precincts will
cast tholr Imllots Tuesdayon

sevui Stntb constitutional
amendmentsIn the first .

floor of the courthouse
That Is. of course. If lltoy

decide tn vote
The six voting boxes art1

being consolidatedinto on
by the county commission-or- e

court tn save election
coals due to lack ef vator
Interest

All city voUng boxes have
been consolidatedthere.

The only voters who wont
vote at the courthouseare
thosenf Precinct 0 who will
vote al Iho Graham Com
muully Coittor. of Precinct
4. who will vote al the

Dr Frank Pickett In a talk
before Post RotarinnsTues-
day took a hard, but
humorous look at the
profo&slpn of the ministry In
which hp noted at the outset
the "fading public imago of
the minister today "

"Tlio church has lost face
along with Ihc ministers In
losing battles to divorce,
domon rum, nnd lex," he
said.

"Once," he reminded lilt
follow Rotarians. ministers
wore I lie most
most educated its
America " He pointed out

expei led tn end of season.
Close ( its C,n 3,700 hales

ginned Ml on yard, gelling
ehuc In Mw end

Planters Gin: R4I! bnlos
(tinned, yard pretty well
cleanedup. Only about llitrd
through mmiy walling for
freWe

Storie Gin: 1.1TI bnlos
jfliinod. yard cloflii. 4tJ0 to
500 more bnles expected.

SeeHarvest,Pagettl)

siKi essful Halloween
Bui as to the "orgnnized"

part. Fire Chief Clary said
that within 30 minutes after
the traditional oulhous:
burning six other fires were
set with old tiros on various
Intersectionsthroughout the
city

"We just went from one to
(he next without going back
to the station." the fire chief
Mid.

The fire ciujltic never uses
its siren on Halloween fires
This takesa bit of the "fun"
mil of it for the youngsters

i SeeHalloween. Page t l)

Tuela nftemoon.
The fire Is oxjipBiDtl to

tnke several dys tn burn
ituHf mH.

UtU eMml4tnlo ws
cmned "Uttofx the Post
Volunteer Fire iJcpartment
helped rescue a $50,000
comtHMt machine from the
iMinrinK burr field a half
mile wwrt of the Kin Tuesday
afternoon

'IXI Aten. stilt manager.
akl Im burrs wore those

from a.000 In 7.000 bales of
thfi i7n cotton orop wjiich
nn Inngrr beiinj(ed to the
Bin Originally, they were
gntuu to be used for
ferlilixw but were turned
hack " 'he nrCMMt mit-o- f

cmUnty owner wasusing the
SeeCotton burrs, I'nHe It)

Jusiit-cbur- Community
Center: and tlawe of Pre-ein-

? who will VOID at the
iMw Southland School;

No state wide AOitlroversy
has arisen ovur UN)' of the
even mendtrtenls. Pro-hab- k

the one which will
al tract the most into rest is
the one to provide an
additional $2o million in
bonds for the VeteransLand
Fund

Due to lack of inltro$l
here. The Dispatch will not
remain open Tuofday night
to provide county wide
election returns oil the
amendments.

The wolls will be opun
imn 7 So a m. le Y p. m.

that for over two conlurlus
in early America all oollugos
anduniversitieswore found-
ed for the primary purpose
to educate ministers

Dr. Plckoit said "you
don't Him) many counterfeits
amongministers," and ns n
group miiriitert have about
the best senseof humor of
any group

He pointed aul that in
twday's tocioty, doctors arc
"riehly rowarUod" for pro-duofc- ti

'icrsJarattJli"In
true(lug puopl. wtloroas
many ministers are Just as

(See Minister PugeID

Only four voting

places for Tuesday

WITH TWINKLE IN EYE

Minister looks at
his own profession

respoctpd,
people
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more fhan hep
A number of sensational stories have

been written aboutthe ripoff of Medicareand
Medicaid by n very small numberof doctors
and assorted health experts through
fraudulent claims.

This brought a congressionalInvestiga-
tion and this week a bill which Presldont
Carter signed Into law putting teeth into

penalties for defrauding taxpayers through

the government's two health programs.

Editorially, we do not applaudthis move
as hflve many newspapers.Insteadwe wish
to make a somberpoint.

Only a very small fraction of
profpsshmalmedical men were involved in
nHyMiueo.Vered frauds.

Tito vast majority aotually dcCry
Medicare andMedicaid for their operational
methods Mast doctors' offices are almost
nverwhelmcdby the paperwork involved in

filing claims underthese programs at
considerableadditional expense

The bureaucrats, we feel sure, haven't
made Hfo easy for the physicianswho treat
the senior cltittens of their communities
under these programs. Certainly, the

We say raxes dcfcnt
Does

A congressworks Its way toward the
adoption of somesort of an energybill,

one premise of President Carter's onorgy
program draws our strong opposition.

We simply don't like the use of tax asa

wtwpnti with which In boat peaplo over tho
headami force them to do the government's
hfcklittft

Far mcample. "the gas tiller's tax." In

whlra auiamobiles which do not reach
certain mileage requirements on gasoline
wwW be taxed with the tax hoaviur on the
ear which failed the worst to moot
KttverHmcntal standards

The house has approved such crazy
tax. The senate refuses do so on the

can

The sccoimI course us is the
MHiral.

Tin kin f taxing something out of

r$bimt brings the problem of what to

tia wttttatt the lax mowey taken in President
Carter prftpMec to return of his
MHwtttv energy taxM back to the people

V all know on the face of it this

phvsiciansare not overpaid.

So now placed in the hands of the
bureaucrats is a terrible new weapon,a law
which makes it a felony and provides
penalties of five years in prison and up to
Sas.000 fines for defrauding the government
with health program claims.

Who is to soy what is fraud and what is a
simple mistakeby someinexperiencedoffice
gtrl? The bureaucrat, that'swho.

The Dispatchhas the gut feeling that a
lot of good physicians are going to take a
long look at this new law beforecontinuing in
the program. We think for somethis will be
the last straw and they will quietly exit from
the program.

Just about any businessmanknows what
power like that in a bureaucrat's handscan
mean if it involves his business.It is simply a
new and dangerousrisk

, Thesolution to preventingfraud with the
government'shealth program is simply
better supervisionof the vast effort.

.hist wait and see. The new felony law
will hurt more than it helps this situation. '

A I
,.53.0' 19 here night.

final

a

a
to

to

most

won't work
whatsoever

with any degree of fairness

Using taxesasa weapon alsowill havea

tremendouseffect upon how the American
economy goes. Obviously whenever some-

body takes a whole bunch of money out of

circulation thingshnvea tendencyto tighten
up in the economy.

Hut getting away from the bad points of
using a tax as an enforcementweapon,the
Imstc argument against such use is that
taxesshould be used only to raise money in a

fair way to help pay the expensesof
government.

When our Inwmakers start using taxes
for anv other reason, then the American

around?it would profor simply.lo-ba-
n. "goj. .neonle are In bjp trouble

flfirVrr1frrn
frryfnK'-tmvfmtsconception.t- o 1ho4fhom ri,.t

most

up

extreme, we somedaybe surrounded
by hugeset of designedto control our

as the somewheredeemed
in be in our best interests.

We haveenough taxesnow. us all
than we like to pay. Let's don't

accept ihe idea of punitive taxes start
down that low road.

YOUNG
is thetimetostart

asavingsaccount...
Get a head start! The sooner
you begin saving regularly
thebiggeryour nesteggwill be
later! Open one of our high in-

terestsavingsaccountstoday!

SENTRY SAVINGS
ASSOCIATION
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u

Post ropers Jim and Tim
Prathcr compete In the
annual Cowboy Fiesta calf
roping In San Angclo. Post
bandIs Invited to
in the WesternDay Parade
at the

and Fat Stock Show in
Ft. Worth. Gnrin County
cotton harvest Is at a
standstill this week due to
drizzly weather. Atomic
energy and Its uses is

to students at
PHS. Emily Potts and
Danny Cooper areelectedas
Mr and Miss FTA Thursday
night. Miss Gayle Hcaton,
brlde-clcc- t of Will Parker
honoredwith bridal shower
at the room. Mr.
and Mrs. Charles Adams
announcethe birth of a son,
Gregory Charlesweighing 7
lbs., 2'j ozs.

15 YKAHS AGO

Garza County
Chest drive will officially
kick off next week, accord-
ing to Bryan Williams,
chairman. City council pass
an ordinance for an

in Post water rates.
The art
show is held in Post with
some 100 guest and artists

from the area.
Postbandwill competeIn an
invitational band contest at

The Postpunitive
Friday Young

that

costing
more

and

finals in Amarillo

participate

SouthwesternExposi-
tion

presented

community

Community

adjust-
ment

attending

no to Seagravcs.

bureaucrats

people of the Presbyterian
Church met Halloween night
to trick or treat for CHOP.

25 YKAHS AGO
Post school student, par-

ents and teachersobserve
All Saints Day with a
Halloween Carnival at Ante-
lope Stadium. Mrs. Chester
Keeton is winner of the
Garza County Citizens-Traffi- c

Commission Safe
Driver Award. Post receiv-
ed no rain during'thc month
of October according to the
official rain guagc. Garza
County added 716 votes to
General Eisenhower's maj-
ority piled up by seventeen
South Plainscounties.
pioneers,spent many hours
rolnllnit mnmnripc nf nlrlpn

'J '
daV$ and now readIT , ,Post

would
a taxes

lives

money

. . .

first

Garza

Texas" on sale at the
Chamber of Commerce
Post Antelopes meet the
Tahoka Bulldogs in a
conferencetilt here Friday
night.

RFllHOSPlIALnOTK

Those admitted to Garza
Memorial Hospital since
Tuesdayof last week were

Greg Pollard, medical
Ann Altmnn. medical
Nancy Thuctt, medical
J. H. Hairc. medical
Kimberly Cole, medical
Kay Wallace,obstetrical
Carl Bray, medical
Heather Tilson. medical
Mike Tatum. medical
B. W. Jones,medical
Steve Davis, medical
Troy Fort, medical
Myrtle Perkins, medical
Concho Saldivar. medical

Dlsmlssrd
Greg Pollard
Ann Altmnn
Joscfina Ramirez
Nancy Thuelt
HoathorTilson
Carl Bray
Kay Wallace
Troy Fort
Steve Davis
J. H. Hairc
Kimberly Cole
Mike Tatum
B. W. Jones
Concho Saldivar

Films on parenting
to begin Sunday

A film eries on parenting
education. "Middle Road
Traveler" will begin at 10

Sundaymorning at the First
Presbyterian Church. 910
West 10th

The twelve part series
designed for junior and
sanlor high youth and their
parent, teachesconcepts
such as discipline, cx
pectatInns, normal growth
patents, communications
and othor Important skills
far good parenting The
entertaining film series,
thirty minutes in length per
episode,will be shown each
week, and the public is
tfnrdlally Invited with no
ArimtaMon charge

Deep wildcat
dry, abandoned

Tho Viking Energy Corpo
ration's wildcat No I John
UAl. 10 miloa southwestof
Pott, ha boon pluggedami
abandoned as a dry hole
afterbeingdrilled to a depth
of 8.308 feel

AMARILLO - With near
1y up for grabs, top
cutting horses from across
the country are heading
here to compete In the
National Cutting Horse A-
ssociation's (NCHA) World
ChampionshipFinals.

The dates are Nov. 3. 4

and 5 at the Trl-Sta- te Fair
groundsColiseum in Amaril-
lo.

One hundred horses arc
expected to compete and
eachof their owners will be
paying a $200 entry fee to
enter. The Agri-Buslnc-

Committee of the Amarillo
Chamber of Commerce,
which Is sponsoring the
event, is adding $20,000 to
the contest,making it one of
the richest cutting events in
the history or the NCHA,
according to Jim Reno,
NCHA President.

Often described as "poet-
ry in motion," cutting
horsesattempt to cut out a
cow from a herd of cattle
and keep the cow from
returning to the herd.
Quickness,agility and "cow
sense" are needed by the
horse to successfully com-
pete in the fast-pace- d action.

ml issffK

Post

upon

must

T

Doesnot cover
stakeholes

and

BY

3024W Pterson
Flint. MJcNoon
Phone (313)

Two divisions will be held
at the Flnnls. Ihe "Open"
division for any competitor
and the "non-pro- " division
restricted to riders who do
not train or show cutting
horses for pay. other than
premium money.

Two will be "held

for each division with the
top twelve advancing to the
flnnls. Non-pr- o flnnls arc
scheduledfor Friday, Nov.
4. at 7:30 p. m. The open
finals Will be held at 7:30 p.
m. Saturday.

A new system of judging
the contestants, termed
Olympic style, will be
instituted at the show. Five
judges, each working

will score each
contestantbetweenGO and 80

points with 70 denoting an
averagescore.The high and
low scores will not be
counted In the final compu-

tation of thescore,saidZack
Wood. NCHA Executive
Secretary.

"The is the last
cutting of the NCHA point
year, and the 1977 World
Champion Cutting Horse
will be decided in AmnriU
lo," Wood said.
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Currently, Poponjtn, n
hjnek stallion owncfd by
Mntlock nnd Carol Rose,
Gainesville, Tcx hri$ a
comfortablelead in ihe open
stniid(ngs,He'senrnedmbrc
thnn ,$28,000 In open culling
competitionso fnr this year.

"In Ihe non-pr- o division,
the Championshipdefinitely
will be decided in Amaril-
lo." Wood said, "with only
$3,500 separating Dnvid
Gage, Wichltn Falls, Tcx
and his horse Kingstreami
andJim Milner. Fori Worth,
who rides Golden Wonder.

Go-roun- begin Thurs-
day. November3, nt 10:00 a.
in. and continue Friday and
Saturday at 11:00 n. m.

V

Dlstfbutod locally

TJhKTt TMi

Happy
Birthday,
Lovey!

Love,
Janie

official into race

frcy. Kent r0Un f'
served Exccim!
Jcsl(lentoflhT
Camber cvjjj

past seven .J

"ward seeking,

A',irom- -Q
Godfrey whose

Hon from UfTCr
became effecl,vcsu
nnmednwiehu. Klna
rnmnniitn im....- -

BILL SANDERS

ExperiencedPost barberhas joined

our crew with Penny Sappington
ana mil vicuriae.

Mac's Barber Shop
218 East Main

ri a rT mikaurynsa onuuMrvi

1:1 1 . I

By

TteJh..

a

of

vear

ft

rr.i
the

ii ir
Saturday, Nov. 12

WACKER'S 2i?asl
ii a ll l

:Mf?W WALLET SIZE

COLOR PORTRAITS

994
32P iFSlSS Extra charge

V: for

tneKicKup
Froiector

From ZEFFLAMB INDUSTRIES, INC.

Lipped on all sides
to prolecl Ribbed bottom

tops of rails promotes
ventilation ana
preventsmolsKre

occumuionon

Tolloato covef

protocts
ontlro talloo1

Worth Out of Your PickupTruck!

polyethylene

Resistantto salts,acids, fertilizers- -

stains,oil andgasoline
Makes cleaning your truck bedew
Available for Chevrolet GMC Fora

and Dodge In longbed or shortbea

fleetsldemodels
Great for campers

AvertableatYour LocalTruckDealer

HAROLD LUCAS MOTORS

MIKE FLANIGAN

4

:
X

3

ar
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tas'artists plan
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Fields. r.,iiinv Artists

Esh nndsnlc

Itlub The event will

H,.. Scurry j
. n m n m.

lui" 0 ' i '
c .nt.ML.

L,r,p for . ..- -!

H I.rn nil II

LdHiSoulh-Ewlcr- n

U and "W",,:
ti roloracio ioiii.--
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U vocalist wim mm-L0-

s orchestra ana

WACKERS

View-Mast- er

fait Disney
liversary Gift Pak

Steamboat

m
SHURFINE

MIXED

VEGETABLES
0Z

3890

SPINACH
15

4$1.00

5Sandbean

Intrr with Mien
Ills font lire film credits ns

nn nctor Include "The
"The Alamo."

"The Quiet Man." "How the
West Was Won." "Mister
Hoherls." and
Autumn." Curtis appeared
us "Festus IlapKen" in a
Gunsmnke episode In 19(52

nnd became a permanent
member of the Gunsmoke
family in I9f3. He appeared
In that series for 12 years

On Sunday.Nov. 0 at 1 p
m. the T.C.A. show and sale
begins In the Scurry County
Coliseum.

Tickets for the banquet,
preview and reception may

from the
Snyder Chamber of Com
merce or by catling 915-57- 3

3558

L fabulous years of Disney memoriesin one
trial mft nak From Willie, the first
irVPM Mnuse cartoonever, to Snow White.
Iro, and Babes in Includes stereo
herand 7 stereoreels (49 Disney scenes),taift
fckageain attractivesioragecanisier.

L

16 CANS

be

$5.99

16 OZ CANS

SHURFINE

15 OZ. CANS

3 for 89c

SHURFINE

OZ. CANS

Searchers".

"Cheyenne

purchased

Toyland.

SHURF1NE

SHURFINE

16 OZ CANS

..Hi,'--;

BANQUET Ken (Festus)
Curtis abovewill be the featuredentertainerat
the TexasCowboy Artists awardsbanquet to be
held Saturday night In Snyder's Scurry County
Coliseum.A featuredvocalist for yearswith the
big bands,he Is best known as "Festus Haggen"
for 12 yearson TV's

Sgf. Jonesnew
recruiter

ARLINGTON. TEX. --
Sgt. Norman A Jones has
recently been assigned as
the Air Force IlecruititiR

in the Post
area. Sergeant Jones is a
graduate of the USAF
Recruiter Course at Lack-
land AFB, Texas,and is well
qualified to presentthe facts
about Air Force career
opportunities to young men
and women.

A veteran of over nine
years Air Force service in
the Vehicle Maintenance
careerfield. SergeantJones
has had assignments in
Utah. Idaho. Washington,
Texas. Florida. Germany
and Thnilpnc.

SergeantJonesis a native
of Eufaula, Okla. He is
married to the former Ms.
Regena Wells of Hanna,
Okla. They have two boys.
He is presently residing in
Lubbock.

Sergeant Jones' office is
locatedat 420G E 50th St . in
.Lubbock. Personsinterested

SHOPPERS
HOLIDAY SALE

NOW PROGRESS

Tomatoes

279C

Blackeye Peas

PORK 'N

BEANS

4$1

HEADLINER

"Gunsmoke."

Post

'Representative

SUGAR

Strawberry HM
Preserves hl7Q tW-f-

lllily

SHURFINE

8 PACK

4H
here tonight

A workshopon method
demonstrationswill be held
Thursday, Nov. 3 at 7 p.m.
in the Gnrza County Court-
house.

Miss Martha Couch will
conduct the workshop and
she will also show the video
tapeof theCountry Five and
Company, Garza County
fourth place stale roundup
winners.

All 4-- members, leaders
and parents arc urged to
attend the workshoD.

HKTl'HNS TO R Kit MA NY
Spec. 4 Jay Rogers

returned to Stuttgardt, Ger-
many last Saturday after a
month-lon- g leave in which
he visited friends and
relatives here. Rogers is a
tank gunner and the son of
Mrs. Iris Truelock.

in Air Force career oppor-

tunities are invited to drop
by the office or call him at
702-700- Call collect, if
necessary

IN

SHURFINE

o SUGAR

18 OZ

jar

SHURFINE

Catsup 79(
19 m nnrnf

Mustard

2690
Toilet Tissue

$1.29

workshop

SHURFINE

Potatoes
16 OZ. CANS

4S1.00

'a

Post'sNewestBusiness!
Watch for GRAND OPENING SALE Coming Soon!

IPREALISTIC
MOBILE CB RADIO

TRC-45- 2 features lighted
SRF meterandchanneldial,
RF gain, ANL and PA
switches,morel

Rog. 139"

10 CHANNEL BASEMOBLIE
UHFVHF SCANNER RADIO

PRO-1- 4 scansand locks-o-n police, fire, Hams
andmorelChannelindicatorlockout switches.
Requiresup to 10 cyrstals. 20-15- 9

REG. $189.95
SPECIAL

SPECIAL

j Join Our Radio Shak Club
You'll receive one free batteryeach month,

worth up to S5.88 annually.

Radio hack
102 W. 8th

16 OZ. CAN

Gal.

SHURFINE

PEACHES

2fW

MILK

Phone
2951

LB.

$79.00

$127.00

SHURFINE

Coffee

$2.69

SHURFINE

MILK
14Vj OZ. CANS

351.00

MARIGOLD

MILK

$1.49
THRU SATURDAY

Plus

mil.
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Our

40-C- H.

Battery

Deposit

i

With the opening of Radio Shak this week, Post for

the first time has a completely equipped electronics
store. Radio Shak has 6,000 stores and dealers from

coast to coast. As an associatestore we stock all the
same items at the same prices as other Radio Shaks.

When Radio Shak has a sale in Lubbock, New York City,

or Dry Gulch, Arizona, you will find that Post's Radio

Shak will have the samesale, on the sameItems, at (he

sameprices.

Come by and look us over and receive your 1978

Radio Shak Catalog. It will contain our prices and the

prices of the other 5,999 Radio Shaks.

Just to give you an idea of what we handle, our

brand new stock includes TV antenna, TV rotators, CB

antennae,CB accessories,CB 40 Channels, coaxial cable,

flashlights, batteries, stereos, 8 track tape decks,
cassette tape recorders, record players, electronic

testers, blank tapes, auto speakers, stereo speakers,
amplifiers, tuners, microphoneand amplifier, stereohead

phones,AM & FM headset, solder iron and accessories,
tape care products, record cleaners and accessories,
fuses, transistors, resistors, transformers,capacitors
and telephonetacks and accessories.

MARSHALL AND TICER

CAR
AM-F- M STEREO

Control-shaft- s for a
factory-installe- d look. Or,
mount underdash. With trim
plate,cable

16 OZ. JARS

16 OZ.

CANS.,

SHURFINE

Cucumber

Chips

SHURFINE

GREEN BEANS

SHURFINE

English Peas
17 oz 3-8- 9c

CANS

6

Hot Bar-B-Q- ue To Go

121 E. Main

JANETT

adjust

Reg. 139"

SPECIAL

w.ro

Dial 495-366- 6

SHURFINE

CORN

4$1.00

4$1 Hi
SHURFINE

CRACKERS
POUND BOX . . 39C

15 OZ

Tomato Sauce
8 0Z

$1.00

SHURFINE

Beets
2-5- 9c

CornerGrocery & Mkt.
Free

Delivery
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WANT AO HATKS
First Insertionper Word

Insertions
pel Word U"

Minimum ii. IS Words 75c

Jti ieK aril of Thanks .:'"

Politica
Column

The Post Dispatch is
authorized to announcethe
candidao of the following
candidatessubject to the
May and June Democratic
Primary Elections:
I'or Congressman.17th Dis-

trict:
A. L Dusty) Rhodes,

Abilene
Charles Stenholm. Stam-

ford
For State Senator. 28th
Senatorial District.

Miscellaneous
PUT YOUR PICTURE or
name on a rt at
Hundley's.

tfc 10-2- 0

FOR DRIVEWAYS. Patios,
fireplaces,sidewalksand all
typesof cementwork. H. F.
Hnwlcy. 495-302-

4tc 10-2- 7

? DO YOU HAVE any
unsightly trees that need
trimming or snwlng down?
Rent ME. Curtis Whitley,
and my ehalii6aw. Call
49S-334-

5tp 10-2- 7

LOSE WEIGHT FAST' See
our "weigh Station" display.
Try Grapefruit Diet Plan
with Diadax Rob Collier
Drug.

Rtp 10-1- 3

ATTENTION COTTON
FARMERS

Custom cotton stripping
Now have a 383 John Deere
stripper ready to go. Call
Lestor Joseyat 257 after 5
p. m

tfQ 10-1- 3

nVS Jfr
LET US COPY ami restore
jwur valuable family por-
traits. See Edmund Finney.
INH Main Street. Tnhokn.
Tex. PImhiu nowam42.

tfc 10-1- 3

CUSTOM UPHOLSTERY.
Call w oh all of your
furniture wpholttoriRg
Senrtwg Post and surround
toft arm for 19 yours. We
pick up attd duftvor. Phone
mtm Kt 2. Box S3. Poat.
tkcm nm

item

Carpentry
Painting

Electrical
Work

FREE ESTIMATES

JAY WOOD
DIAL 3621

Hloclr.
Wheelchair ChiUHSaus

K.K& SKMMCK

WILKINS
K YMoN i MIKK

KIM S !I!H X MmIwh

XJK till ICM-UT- J

Follis Heating

& Air Cond.
Sales Installation

Service

PAYNE
EQUIPMENT

FREE ESTIMATES

DIAL 628-327- 1

WILSON. TEXAS

NllMI TIW
mt

wrturaiMW mmmi x'Mfl

I I A . . L.i" M 111
Thank You

To our friends, we want to
s.-- thank von for the lovely
retirement dinner, beautiful
gifts and lovely eveningyou
planned for us A special
thank von to Mr and Mrs.
Donnie Rogersand Mr. and
Mrs Miller Ray Henry for
the long hours and work
involved In making it
possible.

T C and PearlPolk

would like to say a
special thank you to all my
friends, to Dr. Wilson and
the wonderful nurses for all
their kindnesses to me
during my stay In the
hospital. God blessyou.

Oln Keeton

We wnnt to express our
deep appreciationfor all the
kindness and sympathy
extended to us during the
loss of our little Fronque.
For the many friends that
comeby Mom's, for all the
beautiful flowers, all the
food and most of all for your
wnrm thoughtsand prayers
extended to us. To Bro.
Reece. Dee and Janet
Justire goes a very special
thank you

Uirry. Carol, and
Tracy Cummings

Mnxincnnd.J O Cummings
Walter Debbie and

HeatherFord
Chernand Steve Simpson

Miscellaneous
HOOT & SADDLE

REPAIRS
New anil Used Saddles

KOII WEST SADDLE SHOP
4Mi SW of Post

495-314-3

tfc 10-- 7

BUY NEW Poulin chain saw
and get year's saw chain
sharpening free at Wilkins
Lawnmower & Bike Shop.
640 S. 9tb. Slaton. See us for.
chain saw sharpening.

tfc 4

THE CHOIR MENU for the
Post Toastics Caper Friday
and Saturday night will be
spaghetti with salad and
bread$1.75: Cokes 36 cents:
popcorn 26 cents and coffee
45 cents.

Itc 11-- 3

GET YOUR Fruitcakes
the holiday. Contact any
memberof Pas High School
Choir, also magazlna re-

newals
tfc 11-- 3

CROAK FENCE POST
Arlte llallou

Post.Texas7!Wfi
fiim W. llth Call M.'.vtlM

Up lt-,- 1

FISH TO STOCK Ponds or
prepare for the table.
Channel catfish, rainbow
trout, glagantic, delicious
porch. To place orders call
Joe Poe 49S-300- 4tc 10-2- 0

ONE VACANCY for man at
Twin CedarsNursingHome.
Call 30tt.

tfc 9

S&SCAKINKTSHOP
Cuolom. rosidoMtial. Lhm4-ih- m

and formica top
Pfrnwe

Uelt-1- 3

MR. FAKMRR.KAN'CilRR
NeedVeterinary Supplies

ami Vaccines?
SeeBob Woat SaddleShop

tfc

FOR ALL your lawnmower
and bike salesand service,
new or used,contactWilkins
Lawnmower & hike Shop.
040 S 9th. Slaton

STEAM CARPET
CLEANING

For free estimates on
carpet cleaning call 495-321- 3

Royal Carpet Clean-
ing

tfc M5

" R
MM 8

fifr ANNOUNCING Pre-Seoso-n it
lr on LENNOX SOUR MTUUnXfki

MATK HmI nutans JjisIs .
Ihrnutfh November

tHeating-Air-Conditionlng-She-

et Metal
Weather Doctors

tnl Kesieniiil
M A .nhiimv. Ml -

. Mnawnr Swvir

I
fT 4

For Sale

MOTORCYCLE for sale
1977 Kawasaki (W0. velter
wind lamer, mags, only 900
miles, lots of warranty left
$2500 Call after f p m

i.

11-- 3

FOR SALE: Stereo combi-natio-

Hnrley Davidson
bike and electric stove. Call
after fi p. m. 029-432- 2 or
495-220-

Itc 11-- 3

FOR SALE: Portable Kit-

chen Aid dishwasher. Good
working condition. Call 3113
after 5.

Itc 11-- 3

FOR SALE: New Scarswall
heater 2fi,000 BTU. Call
495-277- 9

Hp 11-- 3

MUST SELL '7f, Chevrolet
van. plush interior, mags,
sidepipes. sunroof, extras
Must seeto appreciate Call
495-348- 1 weekendsonly

2tpll-- 3

FOR SALE: Round baled
hay. with good grain. Call
828-005-

2pll-- 3

FOR SALE: Washing mach'
inc. Needs repair. $20. Call
495-313-

Itc

FOR SALE: 1977 Charger
SE. low mileage,power, air.
bargain price. 495-257- 0.

Up 11-- 3

FOR SALE- - Registered
horned hercford yearling
bulls, ready for service.
Reasonableprice. Call in
Post 495-240- If no answer
call Eliasvillc
collect

Ctc 10-- 0

FOR SALE: 30 International
stripper with basket-mounte-d

on MFarmall with power
steering. Gall 495-207-9.

2tp 10-2- 7

FOR SALE: Cafe booths,
large corner booth, seven
single booths, eight tables
$550. Fair shape.Call 2704.

tfc 10-2- 0

FOR SALE: Clean flntbcd
Ford truck, new engine,new'
tires, one owner. Call

495-220- 3

tfc U-- 3

FOR SALE: 1975 Ford
County Squire Wagon.
Loaded. See at 715 West
13th or call 495-257- 5.

tfc 9-- 8

FOR SALE Alfalfa. CaU
2282 tfc 8

Miscellaneous

FLEA MARKET
21th & Ave. K

Lubbock
Open every weekend, free
parking, free admission
Over 76 dealers.

4tc 10-2- 0

FOR SALE: 1976 HawXtop
shell camper for small
plckuo. Call 2348 after 5.

tfc 10--6

FOR SALE: Heaters, good
used furniture, refrigerat-
ors, cookstoves,new wood
vanities, dog houses, bi-

cycles, and antiques. Ted's
Trading Post. 1205 S. 9th,
Slaton PhoneB28-682- 0

tfc 10-- 1

CMOS!
PHEPAW

M rr--

GEORGE'SBOOT &

SHOE REPAIR
In Rock House on

FM207

Post'Lodge No. 1058
A. F. & A. M.
Regular Meeting

on Second Thursday
JoeWilliam W.M.
I'niil .lonr Sect.

Legal
NOTICE

TheCommissioners'Court
of GarzaCounty, Texas,will
accpl bids for the purchase
of one pickup for Precinct
Three, subject to the
following specifications:

One ton pickup,with 350
engine, automatic trans-
mission, with option for

grill guard, trailer
hitch, rear bumper; engine
must be equipped to use
regular gasoline. Wide bed
long wheel base.

Bids will be receiveduntil
10 o'clock a. m. Monday.
November 14. 1977 in the
office of County Judge,
County Courthouse.Post,
Texas, at which time they
will be openedand consider-
ed.

(The Commissioners'
Court reserves the right to
aedeptor reject any and all
bids

Giles W Dalby.
County Judge.GarzaCounty

2tc 10-2- 8

Real Estate

HOUSE FOR SALE Three
bedroom.709 West 14th 14 x
20 shop. 8x 10 utility room in
back, central heat and
cooling, fruit trees. Call
495-328- 8 after 5.

tfc U-- 3

FOR SALE: Four room and
bath home.302 S. Ave H
Call 495-263-

tfc 10-2- 7

FOR SALE: Three bedroom
mobile home unfurnished
with or without lot. Contact
Roy Harrell. 410 West nth.

2tpU-- 3

FOR SALE: Mobile home 14

x 80. Three bedroom, two
bath, fully carpeted. Call
Jay Hart 495-234-

2tc 10-2- 7

BERTHA- - PRINTZ resi-
dence for sale. Shown by
appointmentonly Call 2015.
300 N. Ave. R.

2tc 10-2- 7

HOUSE FOR SALE AT 605
West 3rd and 410 N. Ave. O.
Both three bedrooms. Call
2704 or 3078.

tfc 10-2- 0

HOUSE FOR SALE: Three
bedroom, large kitchen,
dining room, utility room,
double garage, fully carpet-
ed. Call after 0pm
495-325-

tfc 10-- 6

FOR SALE: Three bedroom
home, central heat, very
comfortable Call 495-231- 1

tfc 10-- 6

For Rent

FOR RENT Three trailer
spaces.Inquire at Jackson's
Cafeteria

tfc 51
FOR RENT Three bedroom
house 514 West 13th Sec
next door

Up 11 3

To Give Away
1VE AWAY Used

carpet Call 495-365- 0 or
495-281-

tfcua
1 Farm & Ranch

Loans
Some ol the many
dvtntjes ol a Im4

Bank Loan,

t Long Term

I flniok lUsaymeftt

Term
Lowest PossMWe

Intern! Cost

MMNHim doting Cost
No fewmerit Penalty
Fast EMcleflt

SeeJay Dee House
Manager, in the j

Post Insurance BldM
Wednesdaysor at 2

1647 Ave. J, Tahoka
Phone998-414- 0

- ..Maawatae- ' " g -

. .

I

''

1

ij,

' i

.

Garage Sales

NEW STOCK OF merchan-
dise Saturday, next door to
Fashion Cleaners. Benefit-
ting the Algeritn Hotel.
Donations of money or
merchandiseappreciated.

Itc U-- 3

CARPORT SALE: Three
families. Women's, men's
clothes, tires, couch, chair
and knicknacks. 71G West
12th. Saturday only.

. Up 11-- 3

GARAGE SALE: Monday
thru Wednesday, 115 N.
Ave. M. Bill Bartlelt.

lie U-- 3

ITER 24

Fit TIE

rr

3cK

TOWELS

I

ICE

iiMNmna

Help wameu

I.APIES WITH PLEASANT
telephonevoice who like to
sell, voti ran earn $4 to $fl nn

hour demonstrating wash
dav products. Call collect

Ask for Don
Slease.

4tp 11-- 3

EARN EXTRA MONEY for

Christmas. World Book and
Child Craft representatives
neededIn the Garza County

area. For local Interview
call Lola Mae Cox B0T.-79-

H924.
9

2tC 11-- 3

4 IHtflfflEM UHEI

Hill

BLEACH T 59c
TISSUE

FOIL Ul25 69

jS MHMfHKCSMNK Vr nnnu

BISCUITS

raNESICLES

lFIEDADS

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

'rM29
ALUMINUM

$489

IT 39

r7

9s1
AA(!

tm VW

I IW

tvm

m.!11
OD1C

m.

401 W. 8th - 419 E.

Lost & round wanted

FOUND A black puppy by
First Baptist Church. Cail
495-347-

Itc 11-- 3

Help Wanted

HELP WANTED Part-tim- e

Thursday-Frida- Bar Keep,
3 to 12 Saturday 12 noon to 4

p m Apply in persoi after
3 30 Weekdays at VFW
Club

lfcll-- 3

i

- i

at

- &

mn I Kill 1 iim i' a'. ... .
. . lOOkmx

ii mm tni. ki
juu in in..

nilf mini,. ",u5
mechanic HJ
495-300- 7 ' " Ct

II. ..

UAUku,
RECORne

TAX SPRUlr
S . DIIMnn...

.h .1 1 tnr fw . . - " Muur
w Luunnrv iv lain

- DIAL 795-800- -
or 363-226- 0

NNt

smt
mi

NUNT

nWESNH MfBMEl 3 -- 12. 1177

oppers'Specials

Pit I
ttMMPaFtti Man

SAUSAGE Z 89c

FRANKS ,69c
HHMFKUt A

BOLOGNA 'if 79

9 Twianacin njm T

M&iz--
fl

CM

BOOKEEPPINQ

POCKET YOOR . jr fVSAVWGS

CRACKERS Hudir
aWwBK

COCKTAIL 79"

SWEET PEAS 3 c,:iB9:

SAUCE Ocw'l

PINK SALMON

syISjT '.T69

waIrs 2M

4f

i
4'l

MXXITVOUft'4

MMWUWI

SHUNRNE

Mam 13th Broadway

FARMFPQ

m. $111

rwWT

2 c,
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meeting
presentod by Bro. F. M.
JtnL'ers nnd his wife ns
pianist.

Some of the pioneers of
Hie county that spoke during
lht program were Mrs.
fionrgo Duckworth, who
enmn to Post in 1R!M) nnd
related experiences she
knew growing up with the
ejly: Mrs. Evelyn Neff. who
('nine to Post In 1905 and
relnled stories of schools
nnd how times were when
she wns small: Tom Bnuch-ie-r.

who moved lo Post when
he wns five and becamen

entile drover: Ray Smith,
who told of his life in Post
nnd how nppreclnllve h'e is

living here In this
community: Mnxinc Marks,
spoke representing David
Newby. Pioneer Program
Chairman,as he wns unable

nlteud. She showed
dinurnms nf the Algerlta
Hotel andspokeof the hopes
Hint it can be renovatedinto

Senior Cilircns meeting
place

Mri fiwen Boron then
displayed several nntiques
nnd keepsakesthat have
been kept In her family
sinPc the 1700s

Fne Mnthis. Trail Blaz-
ers secretary expressed
iood wishes tn all Culture
Club member nnd thanked
them for the lovely dny, The
Invocation wns given by Dr.
Frank Pickett, with the next
meeting scheduledfor Nov.
nnl theWoman'sClubhouse.

Attending the luncheon
from the Culture Club were
Huhv Kirkpntrick. Ruth
Duckworth. Nitn Burress.
Pearl Slorie. Consle Thuett.
Linda Mnlotif. Maxjne
Marks. Mnxine Smith?I'ls
Williams. Joy Dickson. Buc

Bouehier. Beulnh Pic-
kett . I.oree Thnxton. nnd
Opnl Penuell

Needlecraft club
honors birthdays

TheNeedle Craft Club met
October 28 in the home of
Mrs. Sadie Storie. Catherine
Johnson,Johnnie Rogers
nnd Lindn Mnlnuf received
birthday packages.Mem-

bers enjoyed visiting and
discussingmany subjects.

Delicious refreshments
wereserved to the following
membersEula Evans.'Mnr-gi-e

Dietrich. InniS Thucttj
Sclmn Kennedy, Lucy Cal-li- s.

Lindn Malouf, Helen
Richards. Alma Hutto and
one guest. Lucille Lobban.

fixnannfin
expanding cotton usage in
heavyweightapparel fab-

rics, (2) building on the
successof the high cotton
"Natural Blend" program in
lightweight and medium-weig-ht

fabrics with durable
press properties, and (3)
increasing use of cotton in
knits of all types nnd in fire
rctardant apparel.

The home furnishings
market alsowill come in for
special attention, with re-

search, development and
marketing programs de-

signed to increase the
consumptionof cotton in
suchproductsas sheetsand
towels.

Seitz said the entire
product developmentand
marketing effort will be
backed up by a major
advertising program aimed
at keepingcotton'smessage
before the American public.

uauii research" anu

KAY MITCHELL, dircctoh
PHONcTtBOS) 797-837- 5

412 N.

OLD-FASHIONE- D

Take a itep back in time,
to the 19th Century when
Myitlc Seaport was a but-
tling New England shipyard
and waterfront village, to
a way of cooking that
was a unique combination
of pioneer, Indian nnd
English cookery... to an

church supper.
Since churchsupperswere

the only large social gather-
ings in Mystic's early days,
everyone participated with
great gusto. There was a
great deal of culinary rivalry
between the ladles, which
resulted in a magnificent
collection of specialties-chowd- ers,

baked beans,
pics, biscuits, chicken pics,
cakes andcookies.

Many of tho recipes for
thesebudget-minde- d church
supperspecialties have been
preserved and passed down
through the generations.
This Chicken Pie with
Cheese Crust is inspired by
one of Mystic's old recipes.
The filling is layers of chick-
en, hard-cooke- d egg slices
and a rich mushroomsauce,
the pastry topping flavored
with sharp Cheddarcheese.
Versatile Blue Bonnet Mar-
garine gives an d

buttery flavor to the mush-
room sauce and makes a
tender,flaky pastry.

Whether It's a church,r --- .1 !.upper ior a iarBoBuw Cr.nB
or a simple ramily dinner,ti tmuw y uiciiiui y iiuiii tutu
Century Mystic.

CHICKEN PIE WITH
CHEESE CRUST
1 frying

chicken,cut into
pieces

2 quartswater
2 chickenbouillon

cubes
1 cup diced onion

12 cup diced celery
12 cup choppedparsley

1 mediumtomato,
quartered

1 cup sliced mushrooms
12 cup (1 stick) Blue

BonnetMargarine
12 cup unsifted flour

11t

iy FI.KTA WALLS
Sunday services were

brought to us by the Holy
Cross Catholic Church with
Father Jim O'Connor off-
iciating. Father O'Connor
and several church mem-
bers played the guitar nnd
snug religious gospel music
to our residents.

JnElla Sparlin and Dink
Boron of the VFW Ladies
Auxiliary had the monthly
resident birthday parly last
Tuesday.Birthday honorccs
for October were Beatrice
Florence nnd Laura Mae
Vaughn. The VFW Ladies
made the occasiona Hallo-
ween party for the residents
also.

They served cookies and
punch to nil. Hcttie Dudgeon
nlsn brought homcmnde
cookies to the residentsthat

Ec

to be formed
A Home EconomicsStudy

Club will be organized
Monday, Nov. 7 at 2:30 p.m.
in the home of Mrs. Ruby
Jones,Rt. 2, Post.

All persons interested in
becoming better equipped
homemakersshould attend.
There will be no dues and
everyone, regardless of
race, creed, color, national
origin, sex or age is invited
to participate.

The study club is sponsor-
ed by theTexasAgricultural
ExtensionServiceand more
information may be had by
calling Mrs. Paula Cawthon
or Mrs. Ruby Jones. .

i a io salem Ave.
LUBBOCK, TEXA8

CACTUS ALLEY
Ohioinal Art

Bridal Selections
for

Dana Pool
(Bride-Elec- t of Bobby Norman)

Ik postagi
Broadway

CHURCH SUPPER

CcJari lfursinti JJame

Home club

2 teaspoonssalt
18 teaspoonpepper to

4 hard-cooke- d eggs,
sliced

1 eggyolk, slightly
beaten

til -- UI-I. ln iun pww m
heavy saucepot.Lover witha,i Kn..ninn-- "iwhiw'i
12 cud onion, colrv. 14
cup parsley and tomato.
Bring to a boil over medium
Mah hnt. IloHr hni n,l
almmcr for 30 minutes. ?B

Rtmnv. xlilotrnn n'lnn. Is
Remove meat from bones;
dice and set aside. Return 6
skin and bonesto saucepot.
Reducestock to 3 cupsby
boiling rapidly for about 25
to 30 minutes.

Snuto mushrooms andre-

maining 12 cup onion in
margarine. Remove from
heat.Blend in flour, salt and
pepper. Gradually stir In
reduced stock. Return to
heat. Stir constantly until fit

samenliernoon.
Visitors this past week

included JnElln Spnrliu.
Dink Roren. Hettie Dud-
geon. Mary Lou Blair.
Emmn DeBusk. Connie
Cavlnr. Lucille Walker.
Myrl Mnthis. Eva Still.
Ruby KTrkpatrick. C.Aa
Walker. Jim Hundley. Pnuljj
Sherrill. Henrietta Nichols.
Mrs B A Hunter of Mes-quit-e

nnd Beth Blnekwell nf
Spur.

Merry Makers
have meeting

The Merry Mnkers Club
met Tuesday. Oct 25 with
Nora Hencxsnn hosting the
meeting

The president. Norn
called the meeting

In order nnd conducted a
short businessmeeting The
rest nf the afternoon wns
spent visiting nnd having
refreshments.

Seven members andtwo
visitors were present Those
attending included Bonnie
Adnmsnn, Linda Malouf.
Sndie Storie. Maiuhe Petti-grew- .

Opal Williams. Penrl
Storie. the hostess nnd
guests. Edna Peede nnd
Shelin Fayo Bowden

The next mooting will be
in the home of Bonnie
Adamson, November 8 in
Tahoka

" 1 I.
'f. r

J'Dial 241 '

DISH FROM MYSTIC

mixture thickensandcomes
a boil. Remove from

heat, stir In remaining 14
cup parsley.

In a greased
casserole place a layer of

.,1 t etiiHiii'ii, men. . u layer. ui ---
Repeat. Top ;.Vu cheese

"

crust (recipe below), press--

,n. r,r.m'y ? f k

AC
V0,k - Bako at 400 F. to

minutes or until filling
bubbly and CTUSt is

Rldcn, brown-- Makes 4 to
servings,

CheeseCrust. Combine1

Cup unsifted flour and 12
teaspoon salt. Cut In 13
cup Blue Bonnet Margarine.
Lightly beat together 1 egg
and 1 tablespoonwater and
add to flour mixture. Mix in
14 cup grated sharp Ched-
dar cheese. On lightly
floured board roll dough to

top of casserole.

Housewarming
for Boy Harts

Boy nnd Elizabeth Hnrt
were surprised with n
housewarmingof their new
ranch home, located south-
east of Post, on Sunday
afternoon. Oct 23. Guests
called from three to five.

After a tour of the home,
guests were served punch,
coffee aWcookies ''

The hostessespresented
the Harts with a chiming
wall clock Hostessesfor the
affair were Ginger Carlisle,
fiwen Carlisle. Nell Wind-

ham. Ida Wilks. Bobby
Tubbs. Ollie Stevens.Virgie
Young. Rillie Windham.
Helen Miller. Mary Gist.
Marilyn Williams. Stella
Moreland Fern Jones and
Zoe Kirkpntrick

Uappv EirtUay
Nov. 4

W. F. Cato
Rosemary Sparks
ScharlencHolland
Mrs. I. L. Chandler
Dale Cravy
Joy Thomas
Buddy Hays
Carol Peppers
Mrs. Nolan Clary
Doris Kim Stephens
Woody Stone
Eric Cravy

Nov. r
G. C McCrary
L. J. Richardson
Billie Marie Long
F. A. Brownlee
Jo Beth Wartes
Brcndn Lee
Isabel! Gurrerco
Mrs. T. J. Cook
Mrs. Kent Carlisle
Dennis Bell

Nov. r
Johnny Mayfield
Jimmy Keith Bumpan
Mrs. Floyd Hodges
Yolanda Pnnlojn
Becky Bcggs
David Fuentr.

Nov. 7

Ednn Jean Huffman
Paula Kny Owen
T. J. Cook
Judy Florence
Mrs. Ruby Carpenter
Ji'OjyiJp.Bilberry
SteveCoTlazp

Nov. X

Beverly JaneSmith
Mrs. Herbert Hoover
James McAfee
Henrv Harden
Phyllis Harden
Jimmy Nolan
RnsettaDunbar
ChnrlcneSnow
Mrs. Joe Dowell
Anita Looney
Joe Dowcll

Nov. !i

Mrs. Walter Boren
Vernon Lusk
Judity Carol Bennett
George Morales
Mrs. Floyd H. Hodges

Nov. in
Duane Hoover
Norman Cash
Ricky Clary
Elmer Teal
Kelly Lynn Stewart
James Kennedy
Mrs. Hope Robinson
Camilo Cerda
Mrs. Jnnic Hudson
Mrs. J. B Robinson
Rev. Glenn Reece
Mrs. Dan Ziegler
SharonBrutnn

Baby shower for
Mrs. Freddy Huff

The home1of Mrs Giles
Dalby was the scene of a
baby shower honoring Mrs
Freddy Huff. The guests
were received from 7 30
until 9 p.m on Friday. Oct
25

The refreshments served
were punch, cookies, nuts
and mints The hostesses
presented Mrs Huff a
stroller.

SOUTHWEST
CloseoutSale
NOVEMBER 5 & 12

Pottery, Jewelry, Baskets

50 OFF

Buy Now for Christmas!

j

The Post (Tex.) Dispatch Thursday,Nov 3 1977 Pa

to be held Dec. 1

A recreation workshop
will be held Thursday, Dec.
1 from 10 o.m, to 3:30 p.m.
in the Garza County 4--

building with the workshop
sponsored by the Garza
County Hpme Demnnctri-lio- n

Clubs.
Tho workshops are ilk

flowers and country carv-ii-

No material will be
required to make the
flowers. ns packets to make
themwill be on snle for $1 .50

each. Instructions nild pat-

tern for the country

KINS SiU

Willi!
((tlllYl

(WOK

MSISi

?A Kodak ptptr.
Your Life.

i:l

inrvlng will bo available
from the county extension
office contact any HD
member.

alnt) lunebf-o- will be
servedweicli one attending

asked bin their
favorite saladat drinks
will he provided.

The public 'i invited .

attend.

The sphinx mailt hat
pound eyes, with cb .

composod of hunflrfhi. .
seeing units.

Your Pre-School- er Will Love

STORY HOUR

Post Public Library

10 to 11 a.m. Fridays
Bring Your 3 to 5 Year Old

Tomorrow

A Free Library Service

BRIDAL

of

DANA POOL
(Bride Elect of Bobbv Norton) .

HappinessIs . .

Saturday, Nov 12I

9 fo cm

For a

of
LJ

or

A

U to

i.

Cood Look it tfte Tim ....

A Vis

Aba O

FASI MAIN
Im

i Extra 0CVV;t;J",Tl '

Charge VnClJBL 'J

GROUPS TLSSr- -

we use ut mm! km men. ywKi?.
.k HtftM Mt H(K Ml HI M JIr r'NJnr irtwi km . I wu IktM IM Utflxi mmm

lm i'APFR

I

SHUGART

PHOTOS

WACKERS

rnMnHMi

Needamover?Well,getcrackinci
Letyourfingerssendyoupacking

yellow pages

Workshop

SELECTIONS

?)

s
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Burlington's sales up, but not profits
NEW YORK. N Y --

Burlington Industries. Inc..
reports consolidated net
earnings for the fourth
quarter ended Oct. 1. of
$20,699,000. or 74 cents per
share on net unlcs of
$617,480,000.

Consolidated net earnings
for theSeptemberquarter of

1970. as restated for the
FASB-- 8 accountingrules,
were $25,132,000. or 90 cents
per share on net sales of
$698,328,000.

The translation of foreign
currency Items rusults in a
decrease of 8 cents per
share for the fourth quarter
compared to a reduction of
13 cents per share for the
samequarter of last year A

further chargeof 5 centsper
shareagainst fourth quarter
1977 earningsstemmedfrom
the previously announced
oxteiMlon of L1FO inventory
accounting to all manufact-
uring costs in domestic
textile inventories.

For the 1977 fiscal year
ended Oct. t. net sales for
the company were $2,388,-180.00- 0

an increase of 4.5
percentover the $2,284,626,-00-0

of net sales reported for
fiscal 1976 Net earnings for
fiscal 1977 were $89,922,000,
or $3 18 per share on
28.295.000 average shares
outstanding comparedto

Dual phone
listings now

BHOWNF1ELD - Gen-

eral Telephone customers
may now order dual name
listing in the telephone
directory, accordingto O D

Hearn. division manager
This new service allows

residential customersto list
two first names or sets of
initials with a single last
name, if both personsreside
at the same address and
shiire the same phone
number.Nicknamesmay be
included also.

Here are some examples
of dual listings available:

Smith. Samuel & Sarah;
Jones. E. A. (Buddy &

Mary.
Each customer decides

which namewill appearfirst
in the listing.

If onch personwisheshis
or her name to appear first,
customers still have the
option of purchasing an
extra listing at a small
monthly charge

Existing customerswho
soloct t order the dual
name listings will pay a
HtHtme charge,but if other

service Is requestedat the
sametime, such asa second
telephone,m charge will be
rondo.

Nw eudtomers.of course
will httvo theoption of a dual
listing without charge since
"other service'' will be
requestedat the sametime

Testing center
at Crosbyton

CKOSHYTON Crosby
ton GED Centerwill be open
each Tuesdayevening at
7:00 p.m. in Boom I in
CrosbytftH High School

GED teatsare for persons
II year or oWer or 17 year
old who have been out of
school for one year Proofof
UloMtiflcation and social
security number must be
nreaenledprior to tenting

The GED consist of five
MiMeat at a fee of $3 each
One aitbteat is recommended
nor night

Personswishing addition
at mfflrnMlion may contact
Mr Puaaelman at the
Mtaol m-sa-ot or at home
7gl.

J)
lew srrrtt'aiJ

Mr. and Mrs Charles
Waltactt aimflunce the Birth
af a dmightur. Amlrua Ami.
mrn October 2f at 8 47 p

m in Gara Memorial
Hospital weighing ft ir.s V
07S

$101,508,000. as restated, or
$3 74 per share.

While sales for the 1977

fiscal year representeda
new record for Burlington,
net profitability was ad-

versely affected by several
significant factors The 1977

earningsincluded a 17 cents
per share charge due to

rooo wAHtMousr

quantities None

tn i cent per for
1976 The UFO

in
1977 by
Iff cents per for the
full year. In the
wage and fiber cost

the
half of the year

Prices good thru No 9. 1977 at all area Piggly

Wlgglj anil Sav-- ttwei We reserve the right to

wnit sold to dealeis

I

Sauce

Cans
"l

We

Food

currency translation, com-
pared share

inventory
accountingchangemade

decreasedearnings
share
addition,

Increa-
ses Incurred during
latter

UUT I I

squeezedmargins in several
very nppnrel
fabric markets where price
Increases wore Insufficient
to cover thesehigher costs.

In revjewing the year just
Concluded. William A. Klop-man- .

chairman and chief
executiveofficer of Burling-
ton slated. "We were

Farmer

Extra Strength

Hairs. All Varieties

basically pleasedwith our
level of shipments in a year
whereconsumerdemandfor

was generally
unexciting Itetall sales did
show a slight pick-u- p

towards the very end of the
fourth quarter after bolng
generally flat from mid-sprin- g

throughlate summer.
Wo are hopeful this trend
will continue.

"During the fourth quar-
ter, apparel markets wore
verv competitive Our Indus

CHECK USOUT
QUALITY, AND

y sl
Full

Round Boneless Sirloin
Steak,4nS Boast$mmi Steak

$129 7t $149" $129

Pork Full Cut.

Tomato

UUPON

Pork Chops
Ranch Style gM

Sliced Bacon

JumboFranks

Tablets
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Btl

-- Lb.

boi

o'ge I Keemers ruage stripesof

x

89

I 5-o- z. 12'aoz ? 4-o- z.
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TEXAS

trial despite increas
ed pressure
from imports,

the
furnishings area turned In

solid results in all areaswith
the exception of sheeting,

was slow.

was In the
aggregate,despitegenerally
veak textile markets.

Xw bnlnncc n(
yeareiid was in verv
strong and liquid position.

Cut, Bone-I-n Rump or Bottom Round

Pine Oil

All Food

Ply

I
IPOST.

i

Roll

were
and re

at the
same reported (it the
end of 1970 despite the

in Capital
in' 1977

new of $206 million."
In Mr.

"We arehopeful
that the confi-
dence
sustained Hie

throughout
most of 1977 will

' "
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Cleaner
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group

home

which seasonally

group profitable

world
sheet

I

under
excellent control
mnincd

levels

Increase sales.
reached

high
Klop-ma- n

staled,
consumer

levels which hnvo.
general eco-

nomic recovery
continue
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Chunk
GardenH k m Tuna
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Welcome
Federal

Stamp
Customers

competitive
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Tylenol

Baby Magic

Couth Drops
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cr Bounty

taaaaaaW''Y
DentalCream Deiu Gr--m j

Pine-S-ol
09

FrisMes

ffffjS 'liisfeW WmfklaWHaHBBMaBMMuJ In

competilne
performed

satisfactorily

Burlington's International

c

Ripple

39"

Inventories

essentially

expenditures

summary,

RoundSteak l

T-Bo-ne Steak
"Chuck

Beef US!
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I

I
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Pringles

29

Tide
Detergent
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Box

2--

Btl
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Beef

Quarter A Heavy Aeed

Pkg.

Towels.

ng'

Heavy Aged Beef

Lean

SI

Single

'32.

49-o- z.

one
00With the purchase ol $7 50 or

more excluding beer wine t
cigarettes

Whitehouse

Annie Sauce l6or
Can

4
FrancoAmerican With Tomato Sauce n
Spaghetti M "&

Llbby's !
67c cut Beets

WefW4

shareholders

Heavy

Onafl

Del Monte

lbo
Can

PotatoChipsjBx Catsup

85c

49
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PrahdsVeteransDay is no 'fun festival'
PllAHA 0" Sunday

November 0, the

K nreusA Valcnta
In

wig

SSJrtKcwhltonnight of

SiScVol dive bombers

3 zero fighters appear
Slh shocking roar at
Soplevel It won't be his

FORVALUE
ERVICE

Golden

Delicious
Apples

Lbs.

Del 9-o- z. Pkgs.

m

Tomatoes With Chiltes

Sor.iv

"""net's Plain

Del Cut

Green

Ocean

first time.
Thirty-si- x years ago, Fat-

her Vnlenta stood in the
yard beside Schofleld Bar-rack- s

Chapel as the same
kind of aircraft bearing the
same bloodred, rising sun
emblems came screaming
out of a Sundaymorningsky

Red or

57

15-o-

Can

Best Maid, All Varieties

Pack

I

abovePearl Harbor.
Moments later on that

long-ag- o Sunday morning,
Father Valcnta was sprint-
ing toward the basehospital
for duty amid the chaosand
carnage that
America into World War II.

Next Sunday morning,

Grapefruit

JM &4
Potatoes 4 J Prunes oo"

Crop fft TPitf
angerines o3 OrangeJuice 51

Seedless,

iaisins

Green
Beans

franoervy

Hot

IIMniontrllJ

Monte,

Hotel

Chili

4tc
Juice468;$1

87c

Wl PicklesOk
L 99 O

catapulted

MA Jiffy Pop

Betty Crocker

nWTMnUII Pkg.

All Aerosol Room

DeodorantSpray

Wizard

Aunt Jemima Complete Buttermilk

2-L- b.

Box

Father Valcnta and throngs
of soldiers, sailors, marines
and civilians will stand
quietly astheplanesre-for-

in the peaceful skies above
Praha, and, Joined
American olrcraft bearing
insignia of three decades
ago, sweep overhead In n

i. -

New Crop TexaSweet

69

For

Buttered Popcorn

I1UUWM

PancakeFlour

jungle

10-o- z.

final salute . . . the poignant
missing-ma-n formation.

Praha'sannual Veterans
Day Memorial Servicewon't
be found among
festivals in state's
Calendar of Texas Events
produced by State
Department of Highways

Y

U.S. EastTexas Sugary Sweet Del Monte Pitted t
I

Juicy Sweet Kraft's

L,

Monte

Cans

10-o-

Scents,

Can

by
the fun

the

the

No.

Can

5-o- z.

Pkg.

All

59

Dog l
Food II

I WW 15-o- z. I II
Cans Fm

Ortego Canned

Greon CNHes
Oleo-Lik- e

Nu Spread 3
Krafts. VarietiesMM.ug ChteseSprttd

Pkg.

.t

Kraft's Miniature

2

1

v

z

Can

Mb.
Pkgs.

Jar

c

v.

MtomaHows
3&

Transportation.)
and

chartered will that
spot, evenlisted on most
maps, midway between
Houston Antonio
nearFlatonia. They will

entirely rural community
bank, then

49
$00

65

Pkg.

The Posl (Tex.) Dispatch Thursday,Nov. 3, 1977 Page 7

for. storesor offices . only
a community hall maintain-
ed by sturdy Czech farmers
of tho region, andSt. Mary's
Church naslorcd bv the

and Public . . Father Valcnta.
But caravans of cars To him. it's not especially

buses find the remarkable so many
not

and San
find

an
without motel,

b.

assemblefor a Veterans
Day sorvloe "nt Praha. That
Hie Confederate Air Force
should perform the

flyovers. That the
Fifth Army liand from San

...plustheadded
valueof S&H
GreenStampsat
PigglyWiggly

10-L-b.

Bag

9r

spine-tinglin- g

All Purpose

Russet
Potatoes

Freezer Queen

Suppers
All Varieties

$1.35
Pet Ritz

Cobblers
Frozen

$1.09
Mrs Smith's Frozen

Pumpkin
CustardPie

lac o) titt at'!.vt(i tm tcqui'td It b 'adii avail
aMe l oi saif al o lb dr puce m rath
eurpl at prcicall nUrti n h ad

I New Flex Bag. Chipsters. Diggers.
I Flings Korkers I Pretzels. 4V To

10 oz Pkgs

NabiscoSnacks I
'mm o qqc I

Antonio will be there. That
the color guard will be 0 S
Marines from Austin. That
the speakers' platform will
include officers from Fort
Hood's general staff That
representatives of every
American military branch
and veteransorganization
will lie there. Nor that this
year's service coincides
with the annual reunion of
the notional Pearl Harbor
Survivors Associnllon,

How doesa country parish
priest arrange for that kind
of attendanceat a Veterans
Day Memorial Service, not
just this year, but annually'
And in Praha, of all places'

Well, what's unremark
able to Father Valcnta is
somethingelse to the pilots
of the CAF who will nurse
those vintage war birds to
life on this November
morning They've heard of
him with the same kind
of quiet reflection reserved
for names like Leyte. the
Solomon Islands,Saipanand
Okinawa

They call him "Father"
now a gentle
giant in clerical black But
they know that packed in a
trunk at the parish house
are tunic and trousers of
olive drab, a pistol bell that
carried only canteens and
packetsof bandages,jungle
camouflagefatiguesbearing
the gold crossandsilver oak
leaves of a Lieutenant
Colonel in the U. S Army
Chaplain Corps. . garments
well worn, imbued with the
dignity of 32 years' service
for God and country.

The marines know about
this Valcnta; they've heard
of the chaplain who consis-
tently refusedpromotionsto
stay with assault troops
surging in blood-spattere- d

waves across the immense
combatzones of the Pacific

As for the dwindling ranks
of the Pearl HarborSurviv
ors Association. Father
Valcnta is their lifetime
chaplain

And in Washington, the
Department of Defense has
some rather special ar
chives about the Texas
country priest who was
Colonel Valenta whose
service from the first to the
last day of World War II is
recorded as the longest
overseascombat-zon- e re
cord of any chaplain in the
history of the United States

They come to Prahaeach
November. Father Valenta
will insist it is to stand in
solemn tribute beside nine
graves there nearly
identical stonesof Texas
granite . . nearly identical
birth datesfrom the 1920s
nearly identical dates from
the 1940s: "Killed in Act
ion " And of course it is the
reason for the muffled
drums, for the throat-catc-h

tng notes of Taps echoing
over the pastoral country
side, for wider visions of
rows upon rows of white
crosses in fields from
Belgium to Honolulu.

But they will come. too.
while there is still time
becauseit is Col Marcus A

Valenta who asked

DOTS team to
give training

The DEBT Outreach
Training Staff 'DOTS) has
completed its first pre-se- r

vice training meeting in
Post This active community
expressedan intense in
terest in developing an
infant educationprogram
within its community The
DOTS team will provide
training for personnel to
develop a home-baso- d teach
ing program for very young
handicappedmid-o- r high
risk babies The format for
training will involve direct
nn site training as well as
field experiences at the
DEBT demonstrationmodel
in Lubbock.

William Shiver, super
intondont of Post hide
pendent School District
expressed his support for

the implementation of the
infant program. He hasbeen
extremely helpful in r
voloping an infant training
program in Posl

Betty Boren o' Justice
burg will be coordinator of
the Post Hepllcation Pro
jjcot. Participants in the
IJndning session are Kath
le.qn Flultt and Pat Cruse
The (raining will involve a
five day pro-servi- work
shop conducted by Dianne
Garner. Susnn Brown and
Dorothy McGoe of the
DEBT OutreachTraining
Staff.

A systematic referral
procedureIs being develop
od Any persons wishing
more Information or wan?
ing to mako a referral mav
contact Mr. Shiver's office
(495-334- 3 or Betty Boren
R39M3S )



rage a imifsaaj, nov. d, wit m rosuiex.) wspwcn

Baker leads win over DC with 3 touchdowns
Last one is 99 yard

'game breaker-uppe-r'

Senior power runner back
Handy Baker made his
farewell game at Antelope
StadiumFriday night some-

thing to remember.
Not only did he score nil

threePosttouchdowns in the
Antelopes' 20 to 6 triumph
over Denver City's Mus-
tangs,but his last td run in
the third period was a
recordsetting 99 yards from
scrimmage.

The length of the field
scamperlessone scaledthe
fate of the Mustangs right
(here.Everybody playingor
watching knew it. For
Randy, it was a run of
redemption.

Baker fumbled the second
half kickoff and DenverCity
took possession on the Post
20, trailing 12--

The Mustangs' 260-poun-d

fullback Kenneth Harvey
rumbled 14 yards to a first
down on the Post six with
five Lopes hanging on. But
the Lopes dug in for a goal
line stand. Four plays later
they took the ball on downs
on their one-yar-d line.

On the first play from
scrimmage. Baker took a
pitch from Quarterback
Brad Shepherdaround the
right side, after Brad's fake
into themiddle haddrawn in
Mustangdefenses.

Baker turned upficld from
the end zone on the daring
play and simply outran the
ontlre Denver City second--'
nry for the longest known
run from scrimmage in a
Post game.

Thnt made it 18 to 6.

Coach Jackie Brownd,
who had been dipping into
his bag of Halloween tricks
after the first two touch-
downs for unsuccessfultwo-poi- nt

conversion tries, this
time cameup with a winner.

The Lopes ran right but
Shepherd stopped,turned
and threw acrossthe field to
Split End EvansHeaton who
had his man beaten in the
lefLflat in the end zone for
the'gamesfinal two points.

Trom that point on the
game got ragged with
penalties stopping cither
team before it could move
vary far if the other team
didn't.

The Lopes tried just about
everything in their trick bag
in this interesting head-knock-er

and threw more
passes with more success
ttMM they had all season

Quarterback Brad Shep-
herd, afeo making Ms final
appearancebefore thehome
folks, completed six of 10

passeswith the overhead
strikes loading directly to
Post's first two touchdowns.

All told Postgot 101 yards
in sevencompletions(Bryan
Complon got one) but five
"sacks" for a total of 41

yards In losses cut the net
passingyardage to an even
m.

What made the passing
more effective against the
Mustangswasthe variety of

receiversShepherdused He
completed throws to both
ends and four different
backs.

All told, Baker rushed for
167 yards on 13 carries and
caught one pass for 31
additional yards before he
was carried off the field
early in the fourth period
with his ankle rcinjurcd
after big Harvey fell on it
after he had been tackled

Anotherbright spot In the
Lope offense was the
running of Halfback Cliff
Kirkpatrick, who is only a
junior and will be back next
year. He picked up 70 yards
in seven carries including a

O.XMK STATISTICS

Post DenverCity
14 First Downs 10

288 Yards Rushing 140

7 of 1 1 PassesCompleted 4 of
7 of 11 PassesComp. 4 of 17

60 Net Yds. Passing 70
5 Penalties 5

Punts- Ave.
4-- 2 Fumbles-Los-t 3-- 2

nifty scamperand a
17 yard sizzlcr.

Here's how the game
went :

After an exchangeof first
quarterkicks, Lope Tackle
Jeff Greene recovered a
punt which bounced off the
chestof the Mustangsafety
on the DC 18.

On the first play,
hard passedto Heaton for 15

yards and a first down on
the DC 3. Baker rammed
into the middle for the first
touchdown of the gamewith
6:50 on the clock.

Postdidn't try to kick any
conversionpoints this night.
Shepherd was unsuccessful
trying to pass for the
conversionpoints off a fake
kick formation when he got
a strong rush from the right
side.

Kirkpatrick returneda DC
punt 16 yards to the Post 41

moments later and then
broke ,away .on a njfty
brokcnficld run of 25 .yards
for a first down on "the
Mustang31.

That threat endedright
there when a pitchout went
awry and Denver City
recovered

Early in the second
period, Denver City made
its only real scoringmoveof
the gamegoing 46 yards for
Its touchdown with a 19 yard
pass and then a 29-ya- rd

completion from Quarter-
backGlenn Boomerto Jerry
Hill in the end zone.
Boomer'splacementkick
was wide

Post went 78 yards in eight
plays for its second tally
with only 45 seconds left in
the half.

Big plays in the drive
were a 10 yard run by
Baker, a pass-ru-n to
Baker,anda passto
End Ronald Bratchcr who
was shoved out on the
Denver City 9.

Baker took a pitchout left

Wtmon
EE3B

THUDDDDD 260 pound Denver City Fullback
KennethHarvey is face down on the turf as the
Mustangs attempted to move the ball in
AntelopeStadium here Friday night, going down
to their third straight defeat at the hands of the

Coach Joe Giddcns'
seventh grade

football team won the
district football champion-
ship at Roosevelt last
Thursday night by coming
from behind in the second
half to scorean 8 to 6 victory
over the Roosevelt 7th
graders in what developed
into a tough defensive ball
game.

Now 9-- 0 for the 1977
season,the Post youngsters
along with the eighth

and went in standing up on
the next play.

This time Post tried an
end around off a, take punt
but Heaton was knocked out
of bounds just short of the
flag in the far corner.

After Bnker's third touch-
down in the third, Post had
one other scoring opportun-
ity when Tackle Bruce
Waldrip recovered the sec-
ond fumbled punt by the DC
secondaryon the DC 26.
Post overcame a five yard
penalty to move to a first
down on the 1 1, but a holding
penalty marched off from
eight yards behind theline

. of scrimmage was followed '

by another 15 yards for
clipping when Baker broke
loose on what could have
been a long gainer. It all
wound up with DC holding
for downs on their 15 after
Shepherd ran 19 yards on
fourth down after being
pressuredout of the pocket
trying to pass.

In the fourth with fourth
and incheson their own 47,
Post went for it and got
nothing. But DC took four
cracks and turnedthe ball
back to Post on Post's 37.

With less than two min-
utes to play on their own 41

and needing about 10, Post
tried a weird passplay off a
punt formation in which
Heaton wasback to kick and
then went into the flat as a
passreceiver. The throw-jus- t

missed his fingertips
and the Mustangs had one
last chance

Theymoved from the Post
41 to a first down on the Post

graders will close out their
seasonin Antelope Stadium
tonight in a non-distri-

gamengninst Colorado City.
The seventhgraders lead

off the double bill at 5:30
p.m., giving local fans the
third and final opportunity
of the seasonto sec this fine
young learn in action.

At Roosevelt last Thurs-
day night, Roosevelt scored
first to take n 6-- 0 hnlftime
lead.

In the third period, Post
drove 60 yards for its
touchdown with Wingbnck
Will Kirkpnfrick going the
last five yards for the tally
to tie the score.

cashed in on a pass
deflected by Post defenders
here last evening
to score in the final 20
secondsof play and tic the

22-2- 2 in a
game.

Coach Lane
club will be idle this
weekend their final
game of the season here
againstRoosevelt
Nov. 10.

Right now the local

13 from where two passes
fell as time ran
out.

Harvey, moved from the
line to fullback for DC four
gamesago, gained56 yards
for the visitors on 13 carries
andplayedat nose guard on
defense, making yards up
the middle mighty hard to
come by.

For the record, it was
Post's first ever third

win over Denver
City.

You could tell these are
lean nights for the

They walked out to
warm up before the game,
instead of running all 23
of them

Post team SteveHair,
on with arms Bud Jones,
No. 74, and Carlos No. 33, both
on centerand left, and Cliff Kirkpatrick, No.
and Evans No. 11 right. (Staff Photo)

7th gradersare district champs

Frosh in 22-2-2 tie
with Littlefield
Littlefield's freshmen

Thursday

Post,ifrcshmen
non-distri-

Tannchill's

nwaiting

Thursday,

Incomplete

straight

Mus-
tangs.

Lopes
qround Harvey;

Varela, looking

Heaton,

Quarterback Tim Tanne-hil-l
scored the winning

points when he ran abootleg
around left end.

Fullback and nose guard
Mark Odom suffered a
broken ankle in the first
period and was taken to
Mercy Hospital In Slaton for
treatment. He remained
three nights and two days in
the hospital there before
being brought to Post
Sunday.

Post's eighth grade team
also was n winner nt
Roosevelt,taking a 12 to 8

decision over the Rooscvolt
eighth graders.

Post marched 70 yards in

freshmen have a seasonal
slate of 5 wins, two losses
and one tie with the district
mark being 4-- the only loss
there being to Slaton
currently unbeatenJor dis-

trict .honors.
Fullback Gary Baker put

Post ahead in the first
period when he rammed
acrossfrom three yards out
for the first touchdown.
Alonzo Luna scored on a
sweep for the two conver-
sion points.

Littlefield the score
early in the second, but
shortly before hnlftime in-

termission Bakerran in his
secondtouchdown from nine
yards out.

Quarterback Drew Kirk
patrick passed to Alvin
Taylor for the two extras,
making the score 16 to 8 for
Post at the half.

The third period was
scoreless,but Littlefield tied
the score again early in the
fourth period.

Post's final touchdown
cameon a d passplay
from Kirkpatrick to Wing-bac- k

Charles Curtis.
Then came Littlefield's

score in the final secondson
a pass deflected the

8t nmm, mums
mm I v , otouottfi errrwfsivw J - jlt- -s 9
8i I

mm injMJ ip ii iw ttxea

3

Identifiable ore 81,
around

45,

tied

into

the first period for their first
touchdown, consumingse-

ven minutes of the eight
minute period in the drive.
Quarterback Gary Lamb
went the final threeyards on
a sneak for the TD.

Post got Its winning score
with only three secondsleft
in the first half when
Qunrlcrback Roy Gonzales
passed 25 ynrds to Ricky
Brown for the r.

Conversion efforts failed
after both touchdowns.

Roosevelt got its touch-

down andaddedits extrasin
the fourth period.

Conch Giddcns credited
the Post 8th graders with a
"super defensiveeffort" in
the victory Roosevelt got
away for only one long run
all night, that setting up
their touchdown.

The eighth graders will
wind up their campaign at
7:30 p.m. tonight in the
secondgame of a grid twin
bill with Colorado City here.

18 girls into
Brownie troop

Minuuie Troop 35 met
No I at the Girl Scout
House for their investiture
service The parents were
invited to this ceremony
vvhirb look place at 3 p. m

Barbara Hcece and Sher--r

Crnwnover. Brownie
leaderspinned the girls nnd
the girls said the Brownie
Promise nnd sang the
Brownie Smile song

The mothers and Brown-
ies were then served punch
and cookies. The adult
leaders attending the meet-
ing were Ruby Jones.Nedra
Shults. Mnzelle Rogers and
Carol Peppers.

The Brownies inducted
were Billic Lynns. Jancll
Jones.HeatherHunsnkcr,
Brittany Gandy. Angle
Cruse. RebeccaCrownover,
Trnci Bush. Teresa Ynr-hroug- h.

Kristy Carpenter.
Also Melnnie Reece,Tandi

Rogers.NanetteSanchez.
Llsn Shults. Teresa Shults,
Cheryl Thompson.Margaret
Wynne. Christy Clnrk nnd
Stnry Crnwnover

hands of n Littlefield
receiver by a Postdefender.
With the game hanging In
the balance. Littlefield fail
ed on lis conversionfry.

Pork

Chops

,1

Slaton, Idalou

face tough foes
The Old Prognostlcntor

thinks maybe ho has n
bunchof closegnmcs on his
hands this week as the 1977

grid season continues into
the final showdown stage.

For example, Slaton Jour-
neysto Tnhoknthis week for
their third vital district
clash in a row. They were
"away up" for their big win
here over the Lopes two
weeksngo, but could hardly
get off the floor emotionally
for Frcnshlp last Friday
night and barely eked out a
7-- 0 win.

Fullback Clifford Bailey
should give the Tigers a real
workout with his power
running. Don't forget cither
the Bulldogs haven't lost
sincethe Lopes nippedthem
here in the final secondsof
play in a thriller in late
Seplember.

Still. SLATON at Tahoka.
The Tigers have too much
talent to stumble now after
regaining their balance last
week.

Theother two 5AA clashes
should both be tight.

Cooper at FRENSHIP.
After the Tigers emotional
peak at Slaton last Friday
night the Piratescould catch
them "down" and squeeze
them in a low score game.
But the Old Prog likes
anotherFrcnshlp "field gonl
win."

Denver City nt ROOSE-

VELT. Two even clubs nnd
both want this one bad. But
the Old Prog figures the
Eagles to still be improving
(Tahoka had an awfully
rough go with them two
weeks ago) and the Mus-
tangsare merely desperate.

Floydadaat IDALOU. The
Old Prog's heart tells him to
pick the Winds here in the
"upset special"but his head
waggles a vigorous no-n-

State ranked or no, the

HAPPY

FARM BUREAU
InsuranceFor

BLUE
BRAD LOTT,

Robert Harvick,

Phones 998 4320 &

TAHOKA

REG.

$1.49 lb.

Half Beef

1

Winds have w...
winninE 4AA

" "I'M
Ihelr chanceto grab ?haa title tie (They've f2
lost

in
toTulia)

.

unbeaten In Dlslricl (All
and annnrpiiii,, k...v
he Playoffs M rSCoahoma.
Stamford at COAHmn

strong now f'
The Old Prognosticate

still gloating over his se
perfect Friday night
week when he picked J

lunulaant i

seasonalpercentaget0

Last week's result. iL

Post and seasonalopJ
Post 20, Denver City

'Slaton 7, FrenshiDd
Tahoka

.

28, Lubbock Coop.

v. I i

Tulla 18, Locknev I?

Floydada 33, Abcrnathjt
Colorado City 29, BjIIij.

ger i.
Coahoma 40, Winters i

Diabetic group to

hear two speakers

The greaterLubbock chap,

ter of the American Diabet

es Association will meet ill
7:30 p.m Monday in fa

parish hall of the Redeem
Lutheran Church, 22nd isi
Ave. W, in Lubbock

Dan Gonzales, respirator) I

merapisi. ana ur ,

Marrow, will speak oil

"Awareness of Respiralorjj

Problems in the Diabetic"

and "New Approaches ti

Researchin Diabetes." Al

interested persons are a
cournged to attend

BIRTHDAY,

STEVE!

Love,
Totin
Linda
Mandy
and the
Gonzales

INSURANCE

All Your Needs

M
LIABILITY

CROSS-BLU- E SHIELD

SPECIAL AGENT

Agency Mgr.

998-459- Res Phone 998 4779

TEXAS

$1.29
REG. $1.29, MILD, MEDIUM OR HOT, WHOLE HOG

SAUSAGE lb.

lb- -

lAPkcnw Done
h

lb. 89C

Beef Liver r. 290!

jniiiiiiiiii num..
MpAAfes

121 South
DIAL J

--jpi
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COMING Brldgeman
making an ice cone at The

She is employed through the
program.

Treasaworking her
way toward college

Hridgcmnn em-

ployed by Inc.
n of the

at Post High
.School.

a has
worked Jit the Dairy Queen
for approximately four

Her previous ex-

perience at
Super Dog

Gene's coffee shop, so
work comesfair-

ly easilv to her.
There are several duties

that Treasa must
tjie course of her

shift. She waits on custo-- i

tsand takes theirorders.
She is responsible for
restocking cream, top-

pings, cones,cups,and other
equipment. After the

closes.Treasa helps
clean up for in the

The Dairy
by Mr.

are mrs. joan uunara ana
Miss Henry Etta Cruse.

rronsn ptnnvs nor inn n n
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CONE Treasa
shown

Dairy Queen.
HECE (Staff Photo)

is

member HECE

Treasa. junior,

months.
includes

Boston's

restaurant

perform
during

ice
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it opening
morning.
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feels that it has benefitted
her. "I enjoy meeting the
different kinds of people,"
she says.

After graduation from
high school. Treasa plans to
attend Texas Tech Univer-
sity.

Choir will

serve supper
The Post High School

Choir will be serving
spaghettisupperprior to the
Music Club's presentationof
"The Great Post Toasties
Caper" on Friday and
Saturday nights.

The meal will include
spaghetti with meat sauce,
tossedsalad and homemade
bread. Pricefor a plate will
be $1.75 with drinks being 25
cents i ;

. FutTds'wtll 'be used foVthe
choir's trip later in' the year.

Everyone is urged to
attend for an evening of
good food and good enter-
tainment.

Acrobats perform
at Middle School

The Gilberlos. a family of
outstanding acrobats, per-
formed at Post Middle
School Monday. Oct. 31.

The family consistsof the
parents, a teen-ag-e daugh-

ter, anda youngerson. They
are originally from Bel-

gium, but are now occupied
in touring the United States.
The Gilbcrtos performed
many thrilling acrobaticand
tumbling stunts. Elemen-
tary and middle school
studentsthoroughly enjoyed
the show

This assembly,second in a

series planned for the
students,was paid for with
funds from the middle
school student council

Band given
some advice

The Antelope Marching
Hand held a specialevening
practice last Thursday, to
help them prepare for UIL
Marching contest.

Guest clinician for the
rehearsal was Mr. Greg
Barry, band director at
Wnylaild Baptist College. He
listened to the bandperform
their music and also wat-

ched them march on the
field Mr. Barry gave
several suggestionson im-

provements that could be
made suchas uniformity of
stride, balance and more
accurate playing.

After the clinic, the
Fellowship of Christian
Musiciansserved cookies
and soft drinks to Mr. Barry
and three college students
that he brought with him.
Terry Smith read Psalm 150

and Mr Stringer led the
group in prayer.

Then Mr Bnrry spoke
about the FCM and its
impact on young musicians
in Yexas. He told of his
experiences as a band
director anda Christian and
gaveseveralsuggestionsfor
projects for the Post chapter
of the FCM.

The membersof the band
enjoyed meeting Mr. Barry
and feel that they learned a
great deal during his clinic

VISITS IN CALIFORNIA
Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey

Ritchie flew to Upland.
Calif, for two weeks as
guests of Mr. and Mrs.
RaymondFarrar of Upland.
They visited many interest-
ing places such as Los
Angeles. Long Beach and
Eckart of Pomona, Calif..
They were guests of Mrs.
Ritchie's sister. Mrs. Ruby
Eckart. of Pomona. Calif,
and on the way home thev
visited Mrs. Ritchie's bro-
ther. Jack Grimes and his
family In El Paso

Quail crop

Dalhart to
LUBBOCK Good crops

of quail, turkey anddeerare
Joeingreportedacrossnorth-

west .Texasfrom Dalhart to
Abilene and sportsmen will
find plenty of cover with
adequate moisture in most
area of the Permian Basin
although, some counties in
the Panhandleare still dry.

"We will need some
general rains in the Pan-

handleor face thepossibility
of fire hazards in the field."
said Weldon Fromm. Amn-rill- n

district supervisor.
Quail seasonbegins Nov.

12 and continues through
Feb 12. 1978 with a daily
limit of 12 birds and a
possessionlimit of 3G birds.
This daily limit will include
both bobwhlte and scaled
quail or a combination of
both bagged during the
90-da-y season.

"The South Plains has
received some good rains
and a good crop of birds are
being reported In the
Childress area," said Bill

Pratt. Lubbock district su-

pervisor
Turkey seasonIs the same

as the deer seasonIn Texas
and large broods of young

Tune in to

j"SENI0RS.

By DAVID

The other night at the
Dairy Queen, I was cooking
hamburgers at a fast and
furious rote, when n voice
out of nowhere suddenly
said "Hello David Morrow."
I turnedaroundin a panic (I
get rather jumpy when I

have 18 hamburgers frying,
five corn dogs burning, and
havejust run out of mustard
andpickles)only to discover
that no one was there. As I

resumed my culinary pur-
suits. I heard the voice
again and this time dis-
covered that it belonged to
Lisa Potts, a former PHS
student who was passing
through Post on her way
home from Abilene. II was
nice to see Lisa again and
she said that she saw
several people from Post at
Abilene Christian Univer-
sity, which was having its
annual High School day.
Some of the people from
Post who attended were
Bryan nnd Beth Elliott,
Daijny Nelson and Dr.
Charles McCook.

-- 0-

The senior class and the
choir wish to express their
appreciation to all the

The first senior in spot-
light is Cain Abraham. Cain
is the son of Abel and Gloris
Abraham and has lived in
Post all his life. While in
high school. Cain has
participated In the Spanish
Club. FFA and Horticulture.
After graduation,he plansto
work Cain feels that his
yearsat PHS havebeen "all
right" ,'ind that his educa-
tion has helped him to

good from

Abilene
turkeys arebeingseen in all
the turkey hnbitat except
the Canodian area of the
Panhandle. The Panhandle
deer-turke-y season Is Nov.

A with a 1 mule deer
buck and a 1 white-taile- d

deerbuck limit along with 1

turkey gobbler or bearded
hen.

"The Permain Basin has
received good rains and all
species of wildlife are in
good shape with deer
sporting excellent antler
growth," said David Pal-

mer. Abilene district super-
visor.

The deer-turke- y season
for the Permain Basin which
includes the Lubbock area
through Abilene is Nov.

1 with a variety of
bag limits from 2 to 3 bucks
and from 1 to 2 wild turkey
of either sex.

The wide variety of
hunting seasonsand daily
bag limits in Texasrequires
the sportsman to check the
new 1977-7- 8 Texas hunting
guide prior to the season
These guides are available
at all license vendors and
P&WD offices and contain
valuable information on

Morrow
MORROW

people who came to the
spook house and the Hallo-
ween carnival. Continued
support of worthwhile or-

ganizations In PHS will
result In a better school
situation for all of us.

--O-

This week is open date for
the Antelopes,but there are
a lot of other things going on
that could use a boost of
spirit from the students of
PHS-- Several choir mem
bcrs will be trying out for
the all-regi- choir Satur
day, so be sure to give them
a word of encouragement.

--O-

Somc of the seniors have-receive- d

their ACT scores.A
few of them are less than
pleasedwith the score,but
it's a good thing you took
them this early you will
have plenty of time to take
the lest again!

-- 0-

As I sit here in the typing
room at PHS, I somehow
find myself stealing Becky's
typing paper to write this
columnon. Oh well, consider
it a contribution to a worthy
cause.Becky

understandlife in general a
little belter. "But." he odds,
"The first thing I'm hoping
for In the future is to
graduate."

--0-

Randy Joe Baker is the
next senior in spotlight. The
son of Mr. and Mrs. Ed Ray
Baker. Randy has lived in
Post nearly all his life.
Randy hasbeen an outstand-
ing nihlelp for PHS and has
participated in football,
basketball, track. FFA and
HECE. He wasnamedto the

football teum his
Junior year.

Randy plans to attend
college after graduating
from high school, but he is
unsureof the college he will
choose. When asked about
his views of Post High
School, Randy replied that
he feels that he has gained
some valuable knowledge
that will be of use to him in
the future. "I like school
because it gives me a
chance to be with my
friends," he says.

hunting rules and regu-
lations along with license
requirements.

Everyone hunting deer
and-o- r turkey must havethe
necessarytags including
those hunters under17 and
over 65 years of age
Hunters not required to
purchase the regular hunt-
ing licensecan purchasean
exempt license for $1.25
Both the regular andexempt
Texas hunting license con-

tain the deer-turke- y tags
which must be filled out and
attached to the deer-turke-y

carcass upon ossesslonby
the hunter

v When It Conies to

Automobile Financing
WE'RE READY!

FIRST NATIONAL BANK

ENTERSGUILTY PLEA

Angclita Rosas was ar-
rested last Thursday in tho
Piggly Wlggly store on a
shoplifting charge. She
pleadedguilty in justice of
the' peace court and was
ordered to pay $53.50 in fine
and court costs.

1

Tho moJt
are

of the

HARDWARE STORES

FALL SHOPPERS'

SALE
Continuesthrough

SATURDAY, NOV. 12

Jmi&lCUutj 4
HARDWARE

BARGAIN
of the

I j

GOLD

I VINTAGE

QUANTITIES LIMITED

n
111

primitive modern
flowers mombori

buttercup order.

STORE .J

MONTH

ch,c
;l now juBt:

I ImMm

TRAY TABLE SET
Tray table sot consists of four folding tablos that store
noatlyon caster-mounte- d rack. Greatfor servingguestswhen
space Is a problem, or casual "TV dinner" nights. Choose
the doluxe woodtone-loo- k or gold "look of leatherette"
with a brown border

I X.wfARDWARE STORE :

TOOL
of theMonth

1 1 a. Bk
III M no

LIMITED QUANTITIES
28-DRAW- ER

SMALL PARTS Cabinet
Wetded-stee- l cabinot has 28 compartmentsin 2 sizes.
Dear-plasti- c drawerslet you locatehemsat a glance. Remov-
able plastic dividers hotp keep small parts separated,handy
stopskeep drawersfrom beingpulledout too far. Overall size:
13"Hx12"Wx5-a4"D- . C28

OF POST FDIC HANDY HARDWARE
UBB0CK

HIGHWAY DIAL 3363 &OIL FIELD SUPPLIES
231 E. Main Dial 3036

2fr

L
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DR. FRANK lUTTtRFIILD
Optemttrist

OfFKL Itafcys 1:39 (. 5:M P. M.

HOURS: Thwtfcys l:3t it 5;3t P. M.

jWestMain .. iMir'"

Kg

POST ANTENNA CO., INC.

At

429 EAST

Hours: 9 to 12, 1 to 5 Mondays
through Fridays

Phone 3127
After Hours Call 3603

Jimmy Evans, Manager

Elton Trueblood said, "The worst
blasphemy Is not profanity but lip service."
We Invite you to do two things. First,
worship with us at the PRESBYTERIAN
CHURCH, at 11:00 Sunday, and then, we
will go back Into the world, having
worshipped, and seek to live as God's
people. Come! and Go!

REPORT OF CONDITION

FIRST NATIONAL BANK

Post
In the state of Texas,at the closeof businesson September
30, 1977 published In responseto call makeby Comptrollerof
the Currency,undertitle 12, United StatesCode. Section 161.

Charter number9485

Statementof Resources
and Liabilities

MAIN

Office

Of

NationalBank Region Number 11

Thousands
ASSETS of Dollars

Cash and duefrom banks 3,243
U. S. Treasury securities 650
Obligations of other U. S. Gov't agenciesandcorps 380
Obligationsof Statesandpolitical subdivisions 3,452
FederalReservestockandcorporatestock 14

Federal fundssold and securities purchased
under agreements to resell 1,750

Loans,Total (Excludingunearnedincome) . 14,123
Less: Reserve,for possibleloan losses,.v294
Loans, Net 13,829

Bank premises,furniture and fixtures, and other
assetsrepresentingbankpremises 238

Real estateowned other than bankpremises 35
Other assets. 418
TOTAL ASSETS 24,009

1. 1 A HI L I T 1 E S

Demanddepositsof individuals,prtnshps.,andcorps . .6,267
Time and savingsdepositsof individuals,

prtnshps., and corps 13,156
Deposits of United StatesGovernment 45
Dopos4Uof Statesandpolitical subdivisions 2,388
Deposits of commercialbanks 5
Certified and officers' checks 86
TOTAL DOMESTIC DEPOSITS k, 21,947

Total demanddeposits ,.,7,510
Total time andsavingsdeposits 14,347
Total depositsIn foreignoffices , , , 00
TOTAL DEPOSITS IN DOMESTIC

AND FOREIGNOFFICES 21,947
Other liabilities 299
TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding

subordinatednotesanddebentures)....... ....... .22,246

EQUITY CAPITAL
Coraman stook a. No. sharesauuthoriied 22,500

b. No. sharesoutstanding22,500

(par value). 225
Surplus . 225
Undivided prafMs 1,291
Rosorvcfor contingenciesandother capital reserves 22
TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL 1,763
TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL 24.009

M E M I) It A N I) A

Average for 30 calendar days ending with report date:
Cash and duefrem banks . 3,655
Fed. funds sold and secruities purchased

underagreementsto resell 1,227
Total loans 14,315
Time depositsof $100,000or more In domesticoffices 1,354
Totnl deposits .... ... .22.327
Fed. funds purchasedand securities

sold underagreementsto repurchase 58
TOTAL ASSETS . .. 24,356

Time certificates of deposits In denominationsof
$100,000or more (outstandingasof report date 560

Other time depositsIn amountsof $100,000 or
mre (outstandingasof report date) 693

I, D. Q. (Rob) Robinson, Cashier,of the above-name- d

bank do hereby declare (hat this Report Condition is true
anil orreot q Jhe Iwjgf of my knowledge and belief.

() D. O. ROBINSON
October25, 1977

We. theundersigneddirectorsattest the correctnessof this
statementof resouraosandliabilities. We declare that it has
beon examinedby us. and to the best itt our knowledgeand
belief is true and corroot.

S L8WIS C. MHRHPN. JR.

is LARfW H WlVLARO Direatdrs

COTTON

TALKS
ftOiA

cotton &ofi(iwe.

LUBBOCK - The quality
of High Plains cotton
classed through October 21

has been"fantastic", says
Donald Johnson, Executive
Vice President of Plains
Cotton Growers, Inc., Lub-

bock.
Johnson compared this

year's High Plains fiber
characteristics with those
reportedfrom other areasof
the Cotton Belt and said
"High Plains cotton looks
better by comparison than
ever before, a fact which
will make it saleable in
markets not available to us
in years past."

Grades, micronaire read-
ings and fiber strength
tests all are registering
substantial improvements
over previous years and all
compare favorably with
cotton from other states.

Staple length of High
Plains cotton is always
shorter thanthe national
average,but this Is the only
category in which Lubbock-are-a

cotton falls behind.
"Exceptionally good grow-
ing and harvesting weather
hashelpedraise High Plains
cotton quality in other
respects,"Johnsonexplains,
"but staple is primarily
determined by variety."

Analysis of quality data on
the 415.783 bales classedon
the Plains through October
21, about 13 percent of
estimated area production,
shows a huge 76 percent of
the crop grading Strict Low
Middling White and above.
Latest quality figures from
acrossthe Belt, covering the
2,366,000 bales ginned
through October 1, put only
62 percent of the national
crop in the Strict Low
Middling and better grades.

Only threestates,Arizona,
New Mexico and California
have ginned a higher
percentageof SLM cotton.

Just over 85 percentof the
early Lubbock crop has
"miked" in the premium
range of 3.5 to 4.9, a
.percentageequalledonly by
California.

Fiber strength, or "press-ley,- "

of High Plains cotton
has been excellent to date
this year, with 58 percent
measuring 90,000 psi or
above. This compareswith a
bcltwide average of only 33
percent and Is above all
states except New Mexico
and Georgia.

VISITS RELATIVES
Ruth McAfee spent last

week visiting her daughter
and son-in-la- Mollie and
Earl Daniels in Aransas
Pass. She also visited her
sister-in-la- Mary Patters-
on. She spentsome time in
New Braunfels with her
sister. Annie Meeks. Mrs
Daniels accompaniedher
motherhomeandwill return
this week-en- d

Passenger
Truck
& Tractor

Day

Tabokj

495 3671

Hp370

The Texas Department of
Health will conduct and
coordinate a program of
influenza surveillance dur-
ing the upcoming res-
piratory disease season in
an effort to idcntifyand halt
potential local outbreaks of
influenza.

Unlike last year, no
influenza vaccine will be
provided by federal and
state governments and no
influenza immunization will
be offered in state-operate- d

public health clinics.
"This policy, however,

shouldn't detract from the
importance of an effective
influenza surveillance pro-

gram, says Dr. Charles
Webb. Jr., chief of the
Bureau of Communicable
DiseaseServices of The
Texas Department of
Health.

"Only
program
ruses be

through such n

can influenza
characte

rized anda determinationbe
made of emerging strains.'

Dr. Webb said that in
order to haveenough time to
produce the right vaccines
for the next year, vaccines
areproducedfrom strains of
the current year.

The three typesof influen-
za virus that have been
identified arc called types
A.B, and C. It has been
shown that influenza A and
B viruses change their
genetic make-u-p slightly
each year. These annual
changes arc known as
"drifts". A major shift
which occurs at nproxi-motel- y

intervals has
been observed only for
influenza A.

These genetic changes
have posed a special
problem for developers of
vaccines. As the virus
changesor "drifts", immu-
nity created by previous
infection or vaccines be-

comeslesseffective. When a
completely new virus strain
appears,there hasnot been
sufficient time to produce
the quantities of vaccine
needed.

"New" strains of in-

fluenza A virus may causea
majorfoutbreak aboutevcry)
10 years. For example, In
1957. it was theAsian flu and
in 1968, the Hong Kong.
Influenza causedby type B
virus may have widespread
occurrence,but the disease
is generally milder. Type C
viruses never have been
connected with n larger
epidemic.

"Influenza" information
will be gatheredevery week
from selected physicians
acting as 'sentinel physi-
cians' in the 10 public health
regions and in selected
metropolitanareas,"said
Dr. Webb Last year's
surveillance program was
extremely successful.
Through a physician in San
Antonio, a new strain of
influenze was Isolated and
designatedas

TIRES

Road and Field Service

Terry's Tire Shop
110 NORTH BROADWAY

Night 998-453- 1

998-436- 5

DIAL 806-983-21- 53

Even though free Influ-

enza shots will not be given
this year, the Department
docs recommend that cer-

tain groups be Immunized.
"Each year in Texas we

have had an excess Illness
and death from influenza
among older person," says
Linda L. Chandler. R.N.,
director of Surveillance.
Control, and Information
"We support the Center for
DiseaseControl recommen-
dation that those over 65

years of age receive influ-

enza immunization. We also
recommend flu immuni-
zations for adults, and
childron with chronic con-

ditions such ns heart
disease,bronchitis or

Influenza, or flu, is an
acute respiratory Illness
whose symptoms include
fever, cough, sore throat, a
"runny nose", and general,
aches.Most patientsrecover
completely within n week,
although many continue to
feel unusuallytired for some
time. To the aged or
chronically 111, however, flu
may be a
illness.

During the last century
alone, there hnve been
seven instancesof global
spread, known as pan-

demics, and numerous
epidemics,when the occur-rnnc- c

of influenza is more or
less restricted to one region.

Outbreaks of flu usually
occur abruptly. The disease
spreads through communi-
ties, peaking in about three
weeks and subsiding after
anotherthree to four weeks.
Twenty to 50 percent of
susceptiblemembers of the
population may be affected,
with the highestincidencein
children ages five to 14.

The most frequent com-

plication of flu is n
secondarybacterial infec-
tion in the lower respiratory
tract. Usually these bac-

terial infections can be
successfully treated with
antibiotics In recent years,
however,

especially
among hospital PaiicntSt;

-j- hjnye3be'cn1on(.tholricron&St
Developmental research

is concernedwith deter-
mining the best method of
giving influenza vaccine.
The exact mechanismof
spread by the influenza
virus is not completely
understood,but it is believed
that the agent enters the
body through the upper
respiratory tract. Anti-
bodies produced in that
area, therefore should be
more protective than those
induced in the circulating
blood.

Consequently,nose drops
and sprays arc being
comparod with the more
conventionalinjections.

Vaccines are. of course,
only preventive.They areof
no value nflcr the diseaseis
underway. Physicians us-
ually advise patients with
flu to go to bed, drink plenty
of fluids, and take aspirins
to control fever and nchos.

Contentinentalgets
new Huntley weil

Gorza County has n now
producer in the Huntley
East Field this week. II U
ContinentalOil Co.'s No. 52 '
Huntley East San Andres,
six miles northeastof Post.

The well on lest produced
62 barrels of oil per day plus
250 barrels of water from n
production one of 3.160 to
1.314 feet

Floydodo Livestock
SolesCo.

Sale Every Wednesday--11 AJM.

John McCandless,Owner
Call 806-347-284- 5, Matador
Don McCandless,Manager
Call 806-983-215- 3, Floydada

All Buyers and ConsignersWelcome!

ARP chapter
told of wills

The Post chapter of the
American Association of
Retired Personsmet Oct. 28

in the community center
with 17 personsattending.

The group opened the
meeting with the pledge of
allegianceand n prayer was
given by Darlan While.

President. Ruth Dale in-

troduced the guest speaker,
Preslon Poole who spoke on
the basicfacts of n will and
estnte planning. Following
the talk n question and
answer period was held.

Three new memberswere
added lo AARP. they are
Edun Peede,and Jewel and
Darlan While.

Following the meeting
lunch wns served at the
ceiler. Those attending
wore Sybil Cockrum..Edna
Pectlo. Mike and Virginia
Custer.Mnry Tillman, Ruby
Stanley,Llllie Kitchen. Jack
and Ruth Dale, Garland and
Georgia Dnvies, Darinn
White. Ola Keeton. Moxine
Marks, Glenn Voss. Mable
Dunlnp and Preston Poole

CYF sponsors
spook house

A HauntedHouse was held
at the First Christinn
Church Sunday night nt 7
p.m.. sponsoredby the CYF

Approximately 50 walked
through the eerie house
which included a fortune
teller, a corpse, Count
Drncula and Agntha the
Witch.

A costumecontest was
also held wilb the 4 and 5
year old winners Sara
Alexander and Jnna Hud-man- ,

first through third
grade winners, Jennifer
Owen and Jay Green and
third and fifth grade win-

ners. Kathy Davis. Jackie
Wartes and Greg Haire

Sponsorsfor the CYF are
Mr. and Mrs Delbert
Wartes and Mr and Mrs
Benny Owen

mi

A stream
of

air .

30! W.MAIN
POST, TEXAS
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GarzaCounty Farm
Bureau Insurance

Life-Home.A-

mL

7viuid?jij

Cross
Blue Shield

Lott
Home 495-364- 0

Office-998-43-

NOW OPEN

SouthsideBarberShop

NEW HOURS

Tuesdaysthru Saturdays
a.m. to 5:30p.m.

RONNIE METSGAR
201 E. 5th

tnobil
SIGNS

for your car truck

as as

$15
pair

lnj

Farm-Blu- e

Brad

8

or

low

per

jff

low-co- exposure for your bustneu

less thanhand lettering,
easily transfersfrom one iehlcl

to another 7
Many sizes to choose from ,

.Special trademarks available

Don Amnions SpecialtyAdvJ

Phone2816 Nites 298 POST

heatpump
"THE ELECTRICSAVINGS MACHINE"

HOW MUCH HEAT DOES

THE HEAT PUMP PUMP?

Springtime

MAGNETIC
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If you
won $2, it

in at the
for
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seriesm V tttsH1

WAYS WIN
Play4gamesat ffie sametime

WIN 1000, 100,$25,$5, $2!

115,060incashprizes
sinou
GAME

,215

248 277 Bk JTT.
wv

THOUSANDS OF

your Bingo discshows
have trade

service,counter
instantcash!

52 TO

FILL 4 CORNERS

INSTANT WINNERS!

of anycardand
WIN DOUBLE!
92,0001I 4 I A I

$10.'
No purchasenecessary-g-et

FREE BINGO
DISCSon EACH
STOREVISIT!

(Adults only)

fi
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Shopping really pays could really
big! DoubleCashBingo fun, exciting there

thousands cashprizes waiting awarded.
your Bingo card Bingo discstodaywhen shop.

Easy play just match number your Bingo
number your die-c- ut card slip correct position.

when entire horizontally, vertically, diaqonallv
corners your Bingo discs

checkoutlane servicedeskeachtime come store,
discs get, betteryour chances

ODDS CHART
Oddsstated good thirty days promotion
begins.Odds revisedweekly thereafter
indicateprizes available posted
participatingstores.
OddsEffective November

Number Odds
1

Winners

$2000

number
Prizes20.186

Posl 3, 11

W

with us off and now it
pay off is and

are of to be So
get free and you

to the on disc to the
on and it into the

And you fill an row
or fill all 4 you win! Get free at the

or you into the
The more you the to win!

are for after
will be to

still andwill be in

1,

of
Prize Visit

Total
of

re

1977.

Odds
13
Visits

Odds
26

7 462,857to 1 35,604to 1 17,802to 1

4 231a429to1 17,802 to 1 8,901 to 1

... 1 4j224 to 1 2,112t01

8 27,458to 1 2,1 12 to V 1056jol
4 17,609 to 1 1,355 to 1 677 to 1

8,804to 1

7,330to 1

3,665to 1

179 to 1

161 to 1

Dispatch Nov.

just

677to 1 339 to 1

564 to 1.

X

282 to 1

282 to 1 v 1ft to j
14to4

12to1

Visits

915to

71o 1

6tof
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Halloween--
( Continued Krnm PageOne)

and prevents ciuwds from
following the firemen

town.
As for the outhousewhich

didn't burn, it's gone now.
Tho firemen hauled it
outsidethecity limits and
you guessit burnedit so it
wouldn't be available for the
1978 Halloweenrites here.

"I think we were all
throughfor the night bv 11 D.
m ." Clnry snid. except thai
Is for a fire
at 2:30 a. m. Tuesdayat the
Mclvln Britton residence,
713 West 15th where a fire
started in a kitchen cabinet
under the sink, causing
considerable cabinet dam-
age plus smoke damage to
the house.

One reasonable explana
tipn for the short, well
organizedperiod of "hallo-weo- n

fires" this yoor was
that the Post High School
senior class operated a
highly successful spook
house in a vacant building in
the 200 block East Main
streotuntil 10 p. m. Monday.

They had kid customers
lined up almost a block long
waiting to get in almost all
evening long.

Besides that the Post High
School Choir sponsoreda
Halloween Carnival in the
4-- building, and the Youth
Center sponsoreda science
fiction movie from 9 to 11 p.
m. at the community center.

Trick or trcaters didn't
appear to be out in their
customarylarge numbers
this year seeking goodies,
but many of the smaller
youngsters did dress up in
costumes and go door
knocking for candy.

Minister--
Continued From PaceOne)

well educatedasdoctors.He
dWn't comment in societies
"rewards" to them.

Thon from a personal
point of view, he declared.
"I don't believeanybodyhas
had a more interesting life
than I. I've traveled widely,
had many bizarre experi-
ences,but I'd rathertell you
of thegratifying experiences
I've had."

Jack Alexander inducted
two new members, Brad
Lott and Hospital Admin-
istrator Ed Zintgraff. into the
club prior to Pickett's
homespun talk.- ,,

mobll
MAGNETIC SIGNS

for tmt or fswA

15V-- v

Don Amnions Specialty Adv.
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Local hospital
passeslest'

Garza Memorial Hospital
recently had its annual
reccrtlficatlon survey by the
TexasDepartmentof Health
with no major deficiencies
cited.

The state examination is
conducted In an effort to
insure patients that thebest
possible msdical care is
being provided. Every as
pect of hospital procedures
is evaluated in this week-lon-g

scrutiny Nursing, phy-

sician services, dietary,
radiology, laboratoryand
administration are some of
the areas examined

Upon completionof neces-
sary data, the hospital will
be recommendedfor

to the Social
Security Administration by
the Texas Department of
Health.

"The survey reflects the
concern, dedication and
abilities inherent within the
hospital staff, physicians,
board of directors and
related personnel." Hospital
Administrator Ed Zintgraff
commented.

Harvest--

iCnnllnurd From PageOne)

SouthlandGin 2.500 bales
ginned, maybe 500 more
balescoming

HnckberryCoopGin 7.843
balesginnedof which half is
counted as Garza cotton,
operation cut back to day
crew, maybe 400 bales left.

GrasslandCoop Gin: 4,367
bnles ginned of which
one-fourt- h countedas Garza
cotton. 2rt3 bnles on yard,
maybe 1.000 more bales to
come.

GrasslandProducersCoop
Gin : 5.1B5 bnlos of which one
third is counted as Garza
cotton, operations reduced
from 24 to 12 hours daily,
mnvbe300 to 400 balesleft in
fields.

Pleasant Valley Gin: No
phone contact, estimate of
750 boles used

Cotton burrs--
Continued From PageOne)

burrs for compost
Thecompostmachinewas

wet down and then hauled
out bf the burning ffeIdrbVri'
bulldozer

The Post firemen arrived
in lime to help wet down the
mnchlno. but firemen said
there was no way to
extinguish such a big burr
blaze

Aten said the field was
"really blazing" Tuesday
night He said only three
joints of aluminum irriga-
tion pipe were all that were
lost in the burr fire besides
the burrs themselves

Men said the burrs "were
being worked" Tuesday in
the high wind and blowing
and. and static electricity

verv possibly could have
touchedoff the fire

for rainydays
is aQftst
idta

...md thereU much
tot Mid
in favor of living
for the sunny
dayi, too

A ro(utar savingprogram
viixh w will liuilU up ppitttcuun
UjVJinKt misfuruino .ind miHctl
opportunities, tylitlc ibq oaniwl
miprwii m yur-flcciKH- ukin
Hfgtufic.mily t yiur income
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JUVENILE ALSO ARRESTED AS

Trio plead guilty in

Lucas agency thefts
Several of the recent

thefts from a wrecked
pickup nt the Harold Lucas
Motor Co., havebeensolved,
but the disappearanceof a
drive shaft from a new 1978

pickupon the Lucasnew car
lot was not amongthe thefts
solved or the items recover-
ed.

Three Post youths have
pleaded guilty to different
theft chargesIn thecaseand
one old juvenile
awaits hearing before Pro-
bation Judge Giles W.
DaI by.

Acting as county judge.
Dolby on Friday accepteda
guilty plea from Charlie
Clantnu on a charge of theft
of an $84 tire. He was
sentencedto serve30 days in
the county jail on 10
consecutiveweekends and
ordered to pay $55 court
costs: The weekendconfine-
ment from midnight Fridays
to 5 p. m Sundays will
enablehim to retain his job.

On Monday Garland Dud-le- v

pleadedguilty to theft of
a tire and wheel, value of

4-- H food show
here Saturday

The Garza County 4--

Food Show will be held
Saturday,Nov. 5 at 1 p.m. in
the Post High School
HomcmakingDepartment.

Theme for this year's
show is "Energy Conser-
vation."

Judging will begin at 1:30
with the public invited to a
tasting party and awards
program around 3 p.m. ,
Mrs. Shirley Bland is the
chairman.

Junior and senior winners
of the county show will
compete in the district
contest in Lubbock Nov.12.

Lenders of the 4-- food
groups arc Tommic Wil-

liams, Anne Chaffin, Sheila
Melton. Shirley Bland, Betty
Strlblin. Cindy Overton,
Winnie, Harrell and Donna
Nowcll.

Postings--
( Continued From PageOne)
ports, and no frost either.

--O-

At least it got everybody's
attention that those balmy
fall days may be about over
and if one isn't ready for
cold weather it's high time
to get ready.

--O-

The grocery stores and
super markets just about
"took over" this edition of
The Dispatch as you'll note
when you peck inside.
That's all right with us.
November always is a big
food month leading up as
it does to that American
holiday of over-eatin-

Thanksgiving.

$109. Judge Dalby fined him
$50. ordered him to pay $55
court costs,and gave him a
one year probation of a
r.o-da-y jail sentence.

The same day Randy
Babb also pleadedguilty to
theft of a pair of side
railings from the pickup,
value of $79. He also was
fined $50. ordered to pay $55
court costs and given a
year'sprobationof a 60-da-y

jail sentence.
Both Dudley and Babb

were ordered to pay $15
monthly probation fees for
the duration of their proba-
tions.

Sheriff Jim Pippin said all
the stolen Items were
recoveredso restitution did
not have to made. He said,
however, that officers are
still looking for the mirrors
stolen from the vehicle,
apparently by somebody
else

Fog, showersslow

cotton harvesting
Light shower and heavy

fog slowed High Plains
cotton harvesting Thursday
and Friday, according to
Paul R. Dickson In chargeof
"SDA's Cotton Classing
Office in Lubbock..

Harvest exceeded gin
capacity in southern and
central High Plains counties
where seed cotton was
stored in modules.

New crop trading increas-
ed the week ending October
28, Dickson said. High
Plains growers accepted
bids of 90 to 550 points over
1977 loan rates. Mixed lots of
mostly grades42 and better,
staples29 through 33, mikes
3.5 4.9 brought around
44.00 cents per pound. No
premiums were paid for
grades above 32 or staples
longer than 32.
'Dickson said 171,000 sam-

ples were graded at High
Plains Cotton Classing of-

fices the week endine
October 28. Season's total
stands at 586,300. This

New Mexico man
is buried here

Graveside services for
Hubert Arthur Nicholson. 54.
of Alto. N M . were held at
4:30 p. m. Wednesday in
Terrace Cemetery here.

Nicholson, who was born
in Ralls, died Monday. He
was an employe of the
Ruidoso Water Department.
No Post residents are
among the survivors

Funeral services were
held at 9 a. m. Wednesdayin
the Church of Christ at
Ruidoso.

The Mason Funeral Home
assistedwith the graveside
serviceshere

Happy Birthday,
Coach Steve

Your Sis Olivia Joe
Anita

GarzaAuto
Auto

R. E Cox Co., Inc.
Garza FeedI

Fina
Wear

Is.

Record
$75

The first Post
of

breakfast to offer a $75 cash
prize was a hugh success
from an attendance

A record 54 turned out to
eat scrambled eggs, bacon,
biscuits,gravy and coffee as
guests of The
Shop.

One who wasn't there,
however, was Bob Palmer
whose name was drawn for
the $75 prize.

So at the next
breakfast, the prize will go
up to $100 cash.

Other door prizes were
won as follows:

Transistor radio from
Western Auto, won by Jay
Bird; coffee mugs from
La PostaGifts, won by Mrs.
Sexton Huntley two football
tickets to Denver City game
from Chamberof Commerce
won by SextonHuntley; gift
certificate from Terry's
Togs won by Glen Barley;
and cookie jar from Hud-ma- n

Furniture won by Jay
Pollnrd.

up

Deborah,

compares with only 16,000
gradedby this dateone year
ago, to USDA's

Ser-
vice.

grades from
High Plains ClassingOffices
this week were grade 31 at
33 percent, grade 41 was 30
percent and grade 32
accountedfor 14 percent.

Staple lengths were most-

ly staple 31 at 41 percent,
staple 32 was 27 percent and
staple 33 accounted for 16

percent.

660 library
read

A total of 660 books were
checked out of the Post
Public Library In October
bringing circulation for the
first 10 months of 1977 to
10,133, Librarian Pee Wee
Pierce noted in her monthly
report

This included 570 adult
books and only 90 juvenile
books.

new books
were added to the library
shelves during October
bringing 1977 library

to 554.
Fines, book sales and

donations of $32.64 were
received for the month
bringing this
income to $354.13 for the
year to date.

Helpers--
(ContinuedKrom PageOne)
was provided by the Post
Middle School band.

The chain gang was made
up of Cleao
Joann Blacklock and Bar-
bara Babb.

Last but not least, the
efficient game calling was
done by referees. Evans
Hcaton. Rnymle Holly.
Bruce Wnldrip. and Brad

ThePost Antelope Booster
club the event
with the game's proceedsto
go the athletic
to help pay for a new weight
machine.

THANK YOU MERCHANTS!!

The Graham Center like to
thank the following merchantsfor their donationsand
support for the HalloweenCarnival hekJ at the
Saturday

United SuperMarket
Wackers

Western
Lumber

Supply
Higginbotham-lartlet- t
Leon's Station
Hundley's Men's
Happiness

tee to

THANK YOU!!

crowd
drawn by

quarterly
Chamber, Commerce

stand-
point.

Prescription

quarterly

according
Agricultural Marketing

Prcdomincnt

books

Twenty-fiv- e

ac-

quisitions

miscellaneous

Sapplngton,

Shepherd.

sponsored

department

Community Board would

center
night:

Handy Hardware
Terry'sTos
Jae's
Collier Drug
Trendsfor Men
Twins Fashion
Graham Co-o-p Gin
Lett's White Auto
Dodson'sJewelry

All proceedsfrom the eventwill usedTor repairs
the cen.ter

I PI SCO U N T C ENTER
122 N. Broadway

Prices Good Thursday, Nov. 3 thru Wed., Nov. 9

USE OUR EASY LAYAWAY PLAN. SHOP EARLY WHILE SELECTIONlSGfjnrT
JUST 20 PCT. DOWN LAYS-IT-AWA-

SWEATERS
By Sport-eas-e, 100 Pet. Acrylic

REG.
$5.99

REG $115

BP

Sizes 7-- 12

4 0z.( Hand & Body Lotion

Free

1 sscae j ,

Girls'
Long

$4.80
Skin Quencher

Chapstick

Fragrance

.,,,1

Sleeve

92
by

$1.49..

Tablets

!

Wood Framed

1 Pirturpc
I 10 llll OO By Dynapack With

Different Scenes Automatic Circuit Breaker

I 12 or 6

J REG. $10.99 $880 REG. $9.19 TSS

REG. $1.93.

Honey Hill Bunch

REG.

$12.88,

By

Volts

By Mattel, Club House
and 4 Dolls Included

REG.

$10.30

iiiiiiiiimiiniiiiiiiiiiin
--i

ARM Contac

20

$1.19
BATTERY

CHARGER

5 Oz.
Get a FREE 'Hang

REG.

It Up' with every

tube you buy.

$1.54
JHF CircusTrain

$6.99..

Nerf

Circus Train
By Parker,Toy

Soft and Safe

$5.60
BermudaTriangle

Game
For 8 Yrs. thru Adult

REG. G

$6.99......

Thumbelina Jj?j 1
BY IDEAL

She turns over i(ffSte flHrnB
and muchmore ffllTfSpjSai
$10.30jBHS

Can Opener-Knif- e Sharpener

ly Van Wyck, Great for Christmas

S&i jlgii
Electric Wall Clocks'

By Mratiaii hi WWIe Sj.f3,6fowBd,Ws4.M... 322
WfN'SWNYL Northern.Lather Up

Storm Suit Hot Lather

For Hunting DiSpenS
Fishing or Outdoors

Dad s Christ
Greal forSizes S L

S $2.71 Si


