
ferent agencies, each of which 
plays an important part in local 
and national welfare. 

An interesting and important 
part of the drive is that in which 
students in -the local schools are 
given an opportunity to partici-
pate. Each class room will be fur-
nished small envelopes with red 
feathers, and students will place 
their contributions in the enve-
lopes—and then wear the red 
feather to signify they have had 
a part in this fund raising cam-
paign. 

The local drive for 1964 funds 
has been patterned pretty much 
after the past two drives, which 
have proven very successful. 

Although a greater part of the 
effort will be concentrated on 
next week, w h i c h is officially 
"United Fund Week", workers 
hope to complete their solicita-
tions as quickly as possible. The 
drive will not be closed until a 
greater portion of the citizenship 
has been contacted and given an 
opportunity to participate. 

The United Fund's budget, 
which appears in a half-page ad 
in this week's paper, gives the 
amounts budgeted to the var-
ious agences which will be bene-
fitted by this- drive. 

S 
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Cotton Classing 
Is Increased Here 

His confirmation as local post-
master had culminated over 27 
years of service with the local 
postmaster. He became employed 
at the Munday post office on July 
1, 1936, as substitute clerk. 

Rev. Gilmore Named 
Minister Of Music 
At Goree Church 

Rev. Joe Gilmore of Cisco was 
elected as minister of music, edu-
cation and youth work at the 
First Baptist Church in Goree by 
vote of the church membership 
last Sunday. 

Rev. Gilmore had 17 hours of 
work at the Southwestern Bap-
tist Seminary in Fort Worth, and 
is attending Hardin - Simmons 
University • at the present time. 
He served a Baptist Church in 
Fort Worth in the same capackity 
as at Goree for some three years. 

Rev. Gilmore is married and 
has one son, Bengi, who is 3 
years old. 

Sam Elsey Opens 
Photography Studio 

Sam Elsey, an experienced pho-
tographer. announces this week 
the opening of his studio of pho-
tography in Munday. The studio 
is located at 827 Main St., next 
door to Bud's Beauty Bar. 

Mr. Elsey, a native of Lexing-
ton, Ky., has had some 30 years 
of experience in practically all 
types of photography. He spent 
some 15 years in Hollywood, 
Calif., in this profession and con-
tinued this work during the 15 
years he served in the U. S. Air 
Force. Following his discharge 
after World War II, he operated 
a studio in Phoenix, Ariz., for two 
years, 'then was called back:  into 
the service. 

Mr. and Mrs. Elsey are the par-
ents of 15-year-old twins, Douglas 
and Dolores, who are in high 
school. Mrs. Elsey is employed -as 
a nurse at the Knox County 1-10.3-
pital. 

Mr. Elsey invites the public to 
visit the studio and to call on 
him any time he can be of serv-
ice. 

drive for Haskell's score. 
The first half was a see-saw 

battle, with Munday's defense 
pretty well containing Haskell's 
Thigpen and Ivy. The Indians 
also kept Flores pretty well bot-
tled up, while Alcala made some 
good gains. 

Twice in the first half the In-
dians drove deep into Munday 
territory only to be thwarted—
once on an intercepted pass and 
again on a fumble. 

The fumble came only seconds 
before the half ended when Has-
kell quarterback Davis attempted 
to sneak over from the Mogul 
one yard line. _, 

As he was circipPted at about 
that point, the ball scooted from 
beneath him and was covered by 
Munday. 

The other Haskell drive had 
been stopped about midway in 
the first quarter when a pass by 
Davis was intercepted by Mutt-
day quarterback Skip Lane on 
Munday's goal line. He ran it 
back to the Munday 11 to keep 
the Moguls from being too deep 
in the hole. The interception 
came two plays after Thigpen 
had run 20 yards for a touch-
down only to have called back 
by a backs4in-mdtion penalty. 

Haskell was placed in a deep 
hole at the start of the second 
quarter when Alcala boomed a 
punt for 56 yards down to the 
Haskell 10. The Indians then 
were held in their own end of the 
field until they started to move 
late in the quarter. 

The Indians had been placed in 
another hole early in the first 
quarter when Alcala punted 
down to the Indian one yard line. 

That was where the Indians be-
gan the drive that ended with 
the goal-line interception at the 
other end of the field. 

Thigpen was the game's lead-
ing rusher with 125 yards on 29 
carries. He was followed closely 
by Alcala who went 101 yards on 
13 tries. 

Next came fullback James Ivy 
of Haskell with 74 yards on 34 
carries and Munday fullback 
Lewis Flores with 56 yards on 
14 carries. 
HASKELL 	0 0 8 0—S 
MUNDAY 	0 0 0 0-0 

Beaty's Birds Win 
In Fort Worth Show 

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Baty attend-
ed the 10th 'annual Fort Worth 
Club bird show in Fort Worth 
over the week end. Over 600 birds 
were entered in the show. 

Mr. and Mrs. Baty won "Best 
Bird" in the Finch division and 
best single Finch in the show. 
They were awarded two trophies 
and one rosette for their entries. 

Weather Report 
For seven days ending 7 p.m. 

Oct. 1, 1963, as compiled by H. 
P. Hill, U. S. Weather Observer. 

LOW HIGH 
1963-1962 1963-1962 

Sept. 25 — 64 	.62 	86 	76 
Sept. 26 — 57 	59 	87 	74 
Sept. 27 — 55 	56 	77 	79 
Sept. 28 — 53 	57 	91 	84 
Sept. 29 — 53 	60 	83 	85 
Sept. 30 — 43 	65 	82 	84 
Oct. 1 — 49 	51 	91 	74 
Precipitation 1963 	 15.43 in. 
Precipitation 1962 	 26.92 in. 
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Knox County 
Hospital Notes 

Patients in the Knox County 
Hospital Stpember 30: 

Miss Maud Isbell, Munday; Dr. 
T. S. Edwards, Knox City; E. L. 
Michaels, Rochester; Lorenzo 
and Cristoval Hernandez, Ray-
mondville; 0. L. Grice, Knox 
City; Ardell Scales, Goree; Ro-
berto Rodelo, O'Brien; Dais 
Velve, Old Glory; Mrs. Chas. 
Moorhouse, - Munday; Ted Clary, 
Knox City; Ricky Balderos, Go-
ree; Mrs. Ella M. Bearden, Knox 
City; Mrs. W. A. Harris, Rt. 1, 
Seymour; Mrs.-Ethel Ballard, Ro-
chester; Sam L. White, Knox 
City; Lucia Sepedo and baby, 
Munday; Antonio Pavon, Benja-
min; Mrs. Lee Feemster, Vera; 
Mrs. Kenneth Torres, Rochester; 
Ann Huff, Knox City; Mrs. 
James R. Mord& Munday. 

Patients dismissed since Sep-
tember -24: 

Rose Marie Lopez, O'Brien; 
Alexander Valenzuela, Munday; 
Mrs. Chas. Moorhouse, Munday; 
Roy Tomlinson, Benjamin; Roy 
Day, Knox City; Mrs. Jesse Sil-
ba and baby, Rochester; Leslie 
Price, Rochester; Mrs. J a c lc 
Wade and baby, Knox City; Jo-
Ann Huizar, Vera; Lupe Rocha, 
Munday; Judy Blankenship, Go-
-ree; Dorinda Martinez, Munday; 
Bonnie Shield and twin babies, 
Munday; Balt ozar Montes, 
O'Brien; Mrs. A. A. Smith, Jr., 
Munday; Suzanne Gruben, Knox 
City; Lionel Benanedez; Roches-
ter; Mrs. Jim Huntsman, Knox 
City; Johnny Luiji, Knox City; 
Francesco Gomez, -Munday; H. 

.AV. Moore, o r e e; Willie Mae 
Gray, Munday; Elvera Rios, 
Knox City; Paul Gonzales, Wein-
ert; Donna Hardin, Munday; 
Carlos Rodriquez, Seymour; Mrs. 
Jim Bell, Munday; Emma. Smith, 
Goree; Mrs. Floyd Brown and 
baby, Seymour; Mrs. Effie Pres-
hall, Olney; Mrs. James R. Cop-
pedge, Lubbock; Mrs. It. G. 
Vaughan, Knox City; Mrs. T. C. 
Merrill, Munday; Mrs.' J. L. 
Owen, Munday; Mrs. Vera Cole, 
Seymour; Mrs.. Joe Martinez and 
baby, Munday; Jamie Rocha, 
O'Brien; Tim Guarpardo, Vic-
toria; Alexander Valenzuela, 
Munday. 

f Kracker KrumbS 
Odd Bits Salvaged 

By The Editor 
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United Fund's '64 
Campaign Slated 

Texas Citizen N u xn b e r One 
takes delivery of Texas 65 Health 
Insurance Policy Number One 
for Senior Citizen Number One. 
Governor John Connally purchas-
ed the first Texas 65 Plan sold in 
the s t ate for his 73 year old 

• • 
major- insurance insurance agents organi-
zations in Texas. Left to right, 
Harry Griffiths, of Austin, presi-
dent of the Texas Association of 
Life Underwriters, Governor 
Connally, Ward Collier Jr., of 
Fort Worth, president of the 
Texas Association of Mutual In-
suranec. Agents and Grant Jones, 
of Abilene, president of the Tex-
as Association of Insu re n c e 
Agents. 

mother, Mrs. J. B. Connally, of 
Floresyille. He then purchased 
policies number Two and Three 
tor his wife's parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Arno Brill, of Austin. De-
livering the policies to the Gover-
nor are presidents of the three 

The annual United Fund drive, 
which will raise funds for various 
agencies for 1964, will be official-
ly opened at 8:30 a.m. Tuesday 
with a coffee iat the Shamrock 
Cafe in Munday. All workers in 
the drive are expected to attend—
and the general public is invited 
to this meeting. 

Preparations for the drive have 
been under way for several 
weeks. An important move in the 
drive has been that of sending ad-
vanced letters by workers, ex-
plaining the drive, and asking 
that some thought be given to 
contributions. It is hoped that all 
citizens receiving the letters will 
be ready-to contribute when he is 
called on, thus cutting down in 
the time involved with each con-
tact. 

V. K Moore is general chair-
man of the drive, and other chair-
men are: Goodson Sellers, rural 
district; Charles Baker, business 
section, and Mrs. Rhoads Allen, 
residence, section. In all a total 
of about 60 workers will be call-
ing on the people for contribu-
tions, and it is hoped that the 
budget of -$5,400 will be raised in 
short order. 

The 1964 United Fund drive 
will cover some ten or more dif- 

Moguls Drop 8 to 0 Decision Friday 
Night To Haskell Indians In Thriller 

It's the best thing that ever 
happened to small t owns and 
communities. 

k—k 
And we'll bet there isn't a vol-

unteer solicitor who won't agree 
with us. 

k—k 
We refer to the United Fund 

drives. Our annual drive will be-
gin soon—and it'll be the only 
organized solicitation of funds 
for worthy causes to be held-  in 
Munday during the year. 

k--k 
The drive will get under way 

with a kickoff meeting next 
Tuesday morning, A number of 
volunteer workers will be devot-
ing some time toward raising the 
budget for another year. 

k—k 
Already, some have mailed let-

ters to those whom they are to 
contact. It would be easy for 

• them if you'd read the letter you 
receive, study the various or-
ganizations included in the bud-
get, decide what you will give 
and have it ready w hen your 
"captain" calls on you. 

k—k 
That would be the easiest way 

of all to get rid of this chore for 
an entire year—easy for you and 
easy for the solicitor. 

k—k 
There are ten organizations in-

chided in the budget, which 
amounts to $5,400. In years past, 
before the United Fund was or-
ganized here, this would have 
meant ten separate drive s. A 
number of the volunteer's would 
have been in on each drive. 

k—k 
It meant, too, that you had to 

give of your time to listen to 
the story of ten solicitors. Some-
times, time doesn't mean so 
much; yet, at times a few min-
utes can be very valuable. Under 
the United Fund, there is one 
contact, one solicitation, one con-
tribution, then it's over! 

k—k 	 • 
And don't be disturbed by the 

fact that our community is hop-
ing to raise $5,400. Of course, 
that's a lot of money--but con-
sider the -organizations to be 
benefitted. Decide' how much you 
would give to each, then give one 
total amouht to United Fund. 

k—k 
It isn't necessary to give all at 

once — though, this method is 
quite acceptable. One may pledge 
their amount and give regularly 
each month, if desired. One may 
authorize United Fund to draw 
on his account at the bank 
monthly, quarterly, semi-annual-
ly—any way you want to give. 

assagianamft% Hughes Notified 
Of Confirmation 
As Postmaster 

H. C. Hughes, who had been 
acting postmaster at Munday for 
over a year, last Monday had his 
nomination confirmed by the U. 
S. Senate, at which time his 
status changed from acting post-
master to postmaster. 

He was notified of his confir-
mation by a telegram from Sen-
ator Ralph W. Yarborough which 
read as follows: 'Senate -today 
confirmed your • nomination as 
postmaster. Congratulations." 

Mr. Hughes t o p Ic over 'his 
duties as acting postmaster on 
August 17, 1962. His appointment 
was confirmed by President John 
F. Kennedy on September 6, 1962. 
Kennedy renominated him when 
the present session of Congress 
opened in January, and Hughes 
confirmation had reportedly been 
blocked by Republican opposition 
since that time. 

H. C. HUGHES 
. . . Postmaster Now 

Sample receipts were heavy 
during the week ending Septem-
ber 27 and 9,067 bales were class-
ed for that period, according to 
A. D. Peebles in charge of the 
Munday cotton classing office. 
This laboratory is operated by 
Agricultural Marketing Service 

-of the United States Department 
of Agriculture. 

Grades showed improvement 
beginning about mid-week due to 
more favorable harvest weather 
and the percentage is as follows 
4 per cent white grades, 2 per 
cent strict middling light spot, 58 
per cent middling light spot, 29 
per cent strict low midding light 
spot and 5 per cent low middling 
light spot. 

Staple lengths ran 5 per cent 
7/8, 30 pet cent 29/32, 44 per cent 
15/16, 15 per cent 31/32, and G 
per cent 1 inch and longer. 

Micronaire readings were 5 per 
cent- 3.0-3.4, 22 per cent 3.5.3.9, 
43 per cent 4.0-4.4, 23 per cent 
4.549 and 6 per cent 5.0-5.4. 

'Market activity showed a slight 
increase with light spots that 
will micronaire 3.5 and higher 
bringing 25 to 45 points over the 
loan. 

The Class AA Haskell Indians 
won a football game last Friday 
night 8 to 0 against the fight-
ingest bunch of Munday Moguls 
they'd ever tackled--and then 
only after a fairly even battle 
for almost three periods. 

Ronnie Jeter spelled the differ-
ence for the Indians when 10 of 
the 12 minutes in the third quar-
ter had elapsed. Jeter took the 
ball on fourth down sneaked for 
the neded yard on the 34, slid off 
a bunch of players, found himself 
in the clear and sprinted on for 
the only touchdown. Joe Thig-
pen, Indian tailback, then went. 
around right end for the two 
extra points. 

Munday's star -tailback, Pete 
Alcala, put a scare into his vis-
itors shortly before Jeter's score 
when he slid through right tackle 
side-stepped his tacklers and 
went 52 yards to the Haskell 34. 
He was overtaken from behind as 
he changed pace to elude another 
tackler. The Mogul drive was 
stopped on the next play, when 
Haskell recovered a Munday 
fumble—and that started the 

Earl Brewer Grows 
Big Sweet Potatoes 

F. F. A. Chapter Has 
Meeting On Monday 

The Munday F. F. A. Chapter 
had a called special meeting Mon-
day, September 30, at which time 
the group decided to attend the 
State Fair of Texas on Saturday, 
October 5. 

Jerry Clark, 1962.63 State pres-
ident, spoke to the group on im-
portance of individual responsi-
bilities of each member and his 
organization. 

Burt Williams is chapter ad-
visor. 

Earl Brewer is a Very suc-
cessful farmer, if the bigness 
of things he produces is any 
criterion. 

Mr. Brewer was in town the 
latter part of last week ex-
hibiting some sweet potatoes 
which he had just harvested. 
They appeared too big for po-
tatoes, or even cantaloupes, 
but a mite small for water- 
melons. 	 • 

One of them weighed an 
even four pounds, while the 
runty one weighed only three 
and three-fourths pounds. Mr. 
Brewer said- he had sampled 
one of the large ones and it 
wasn't stringy as most of them 
are, but very firm and tasty. 

k—k 
It is to be regretted that all 

worthy organizations relying on 
public solicitation for financial 
support cannot be included in. 
United Fund campaigns. United 
Funds is willing, we understand, 
but some organizations prefer a 
separate drive. It is good, how-
ever, that a number of these or-
ganizations have a cooperative 
attitude toward United Fund. - 

k—k 
Those that from time to time 

have refused monies collected 
locally for their cause because it 
was raised through a United 
Fund drive do not get a sympa-
thetic ear from us, anymore. We 
don't doubt the worthiness of 
their cause, but their unwilling-
ness to cooperate in what we've 
termed as "the best thing that - ever happened" sorta weakens 	ti's.  

Rhineland 4-H'ers 
Elect New Officers 

Congress Of Parents 
And Teachers Meet 
In Abilene October 10 

Open Date Friday 
The Moguls have an open date 

on Friday of this' week, and will 
be enjoying a rest after four hard 
games. Coaches and fans will 
likely be scouting other teams of 
the district to determine just 
what is 'cut out for them" for 
the remainder of the -season. 

The local team will open dis-
trict play on Friday, October 11, 
against the strong Henrietta 
teain. The game will be on the 
local field. 

Good Neighbors 
Help J. C. Gollehon 

Good neighbors of J. C. Gol-
lehon gathered at his place last 
Monday morning and plowed 
his land for him.. The five 
neighbors had the land plowed 
in a- short time: 

Mr. Gollehon was recently 
transferred to a Dallas hos-
pital for further treatment 
after spending some two weeks 
in the Knox County Hospital. 

Those who helped with the 
plowing are: Ivan Gresham, 
Gus Brown, Boyd Meers, Au-
brey Roden and George Reiden-
bach. 

The Rhinelan d4-11 club met 
September 18 for the election of 
new officers and the admittance 
of new members. 

The following officers were 
elected: • president, Suzan Kuch-
ler; vice president, Judy Brugge-
man; secretarymtreasurer, Mary 
Alice Kuchler; reporter, Debora 
Kuehler; council delegate, Janice 
Kuchler. 

UNDERGOES SURGERY 
E. L. Horton, Jr. under- 

: major surgery at the Hen-
dridz Memorial Hospital in Abi-
lene last Friday. She is reported 
to he recovering nicely but will 
be hospitalized for several days 
longer. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lemley vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. John Lemley in 
Wichita Falls last Sunday. 

Construction Progresses On County's 
Courthouse and Wing To Knox Hospital 

and some offices have new furni-
ture. 

The Hospital project which is a 
much larger one will take more 
time. 

Nine new patient rooms have 
been added, a number of bath 
rooms have been added to. the 
older section, and an entirely new 
kitchen and dining area have 
been extended from the original 
building. Contractors will install 
a new elevator and remodel the 
operating room. 

During the building process the 
hoSpital staff has worked under 
difficulties. A small cafe located 
nearby was leased in which to 
prepare meals for the patients 
and staff. 

A period of 240 working days 
were .allowed for the job. 

Work is progressing nicely on 
two construction projects for 
Knox County—the new wing to 
the Knox County Hospital and 
extensive repairs to the county 
courthouse. 

Bonds in the amount of $125,-
000 for the hospital add;tion and 
$60,000 for the renovation of the 
courthouse in Benjamin were 
voted by county citizens in Sep-
tember, 1962. In March, 1963, the 
contract was let to T. E. Shel-
bourne and Sons of Snyder for 
both projects. 

County Judge L. A. Parker 
said last week that work on the 
courthouse was almost complet-
ed. The entire building has been 
repainted, new ceilings installed, 
floors in most of the building 
recovered, new window blinds 

Mrs. Harold Part ridge visited 
her son -and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charley Partridge and daughter, 
in Wichita Falls last Monday and 
Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Mitchell vis-
ited their niece and husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Novman Marsden, in 
Santo, Texas, last Sunday. Mrs. 
Marsden, the former Becky Ar-
rott, was married In August. 

the flavor of their cause. 
k—k 

Concerning the United Fund 
drives, Gov. John Connally had 
this to say in his proclamation of 
September 18: 

k—k 
"The United community cam-

paigns, frequently called United 
Fund drives, deserve the support 
of everyone. Many worthy activi-
ties benefit from this unified ap-
proach, and the contributor has 
the added satisfaction of know-
ing that whatever he or she gives 
will be used for the greatest pos-
sible good. These coordinated ef-
forts to raise operating funds for 
local and national health, welfare 
and character-building agencies 
make fund-raising more efficient 
and equitable." 

k—k 
Won't you do your part when 

contacted next week? 

ONE FIRE REPORTED 

The only fire reported this 
week was a grass fire at Thomp-
son-Hayward Chemical Co., last 
Friday afternoon. The f ire was 
easily put out. 

Girl Scout Leaders 
To Meet On Tuesday 

Tuesday, October 8, at 9:30 
a.m. the Knox County Girl Scouts 
will have their first neighborhood 
meeting. It will be held in Mun-
day at the First Methodist 
Church. All registered adults 'in 
Knox City -and Munday are urg-
ed to- attend and anyone inter-
ested in Girl Scouting in Knox 
County tis invitee). 

Mrs. Jean Smith, neighborhood 
chairman, will preside. Mrs. Ruth 
Smethie, field adviser for the 
NorCenTex Council, wlil explain 
the purpose of neighborhood 
meetings. Mrs. Smethie will in-
troduce Mrs. Betty Jo Ramsey, 
second vice president of the Nor-
CenTex Ginl Scout Council hoard 
of directors, to the group. 

A new sound film, "This Is Girl 
Scouting," will be shown. After 
this the group will discuss plans 
for Knox County Girl Scouts in 
the coming year. 

AMERICAN LEGION TO 
MEET NEXT TUESDAY 

Lowry Post No. 44 of American 
Legion will hold its regular meet-
ing on Tuesday, October 8, at 
7:30 p.m. at the Legion hall. All 
members are urged to attend. 

UNDERGOES SURGERY 

Oscar Spann underwent surg-
ery at the General Hospital in 
Wichita Falls last Thursday 
morning. He is reported to be 
doing fine. 

"The Family Story! Whose 
Concern, Yours or Ours?" Will 
be theme of the annual workshop 
for District 18 of Texas Congress 
of Parents and Teachers in Abi-
lene Thursday, October 10. The 
session will begin at 8:30 a.m. 
'and adjourn at 2:30 p.m. and will 
be held at the Woman's Club 
Building at 3425 South 14th 
Street. 

Dr. Clifford S. Knape, psycho-
logist, is guest speaker and will 
summarize and evaluate panel 
discussions and skits presented 
in connection with the therne: He 
is connected with the Veteran's 
Administrative Hospital, Waco 
Guidance Center as counseling 
Psychologist and is on the state 
board of Texas Association for 
Mental Health and - is president of 
the Texas Rehabilitation ASsocia-
tion. 

The day's workshop will con-
sist of circle talks, a panel, film 
(and skit. The panel is composed 
of Ed Wishcamper, moderator, 
Mrs. Sallie Hilley, teacher, Floyd 
'Clifton, banker, Dr. Sol B. Estes, 
'doctor, and Mrs. Allan Andruss, 
parent. They will discuss "Fam-
ily Concerns." 

Following a luncheon, a film 
entitled 'Who Shall Decide?" 
will cover areas of parental au-
thority. At 1:30 p.m. a skit with 
Randall Jackson as moderator, 
Billy Fades as Father, Mrs. 
Joyce Lindsey as Mother, W. D. 
Lawson as son and Mrs. Rae 
Phillips as daughter wil depict 
The Family in Decisions, Who 
Shall Make Them? 

Mrs.. D. W. Boren, district 
president, urges everyone to at-
-tend the workshop. 

It : 	
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ton next week. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. L. Bartlett of 
Tulia visited his sister, Mrs. 
Scythia Parmley, in the W. M. 
Yates home last Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Suggs of 
Burkburnett and Mr. Donald 
White of Lubbock visited Mrs. 
Clyde Patton Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Mee of Rose-
well, N. M., visited his sister and 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. J. M. 
Watsoa, ant other relatives here 
over the week:  end. 

Mrs. J. E. Hunter and Judy of 
Knox Clly, visiteli with Mrs. L. E. 
Hunter Friday night. 

Rev. HermanLaux of Rhine-
land parrish visited in the Bill 
Orsak home last Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs.. Pete• Beecher 
were in Dallas for Mr. Beecher to 
have a medical check-up. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. C. Posey of 
Knox City visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Rodgers Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Elliott and 
Mrs. Jess Elliott returned home 
Sunday night after spending last 
week in Houston with Jack El-
liott, who underwent surgery in 
the Anderson hospital there. Mrs. 
Ruby Elliott remained in Hous-
ton with her husband. Mr. Elliott 
is reported to be recovering 
nicely. 

Mrs. Mayme Fitzgerald return-
ed home Thursday f r o m three 
weeks visit with her brother, 
Frank Cowsar, in Gainsville. Mr. 
Cowsar underwent surgery and 
was seriously ill for several days, 
but he is reported to be very 
much improved. 

Mr. and Mrs. Allan Bingham 
and sons, Brad and Clay, of Ama-
rillo visited Sunday night with 
Mrs. Bingham's parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. L. Raskin; 	• 

Mr. and Mrs. C. T: West visit-
ed their daughter and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Moore, and 
attended the Ice Capades in Lub-
bock last week. 

Mrs. Sam Portwood of Round 
Timber visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Allen and family, 
last Monday. 

Miss Pat Steward and a friend, 
Miss Connie Crew, of Waco spent 
the week end with Pat's parents, 

"What a man does for himself dies with him what he does 
for his community lives on and on." 

Mr.. and Mrs. Jack Steward and 
Tonya. 

Roy Moore and Vernon Routon 
spent the week end with their 
new granddaughter, little Debo-
rah Kay Coody, and her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Coody and 
family, in Farmers Branch. 

Mr. Raymond Lane, Johnnie 
and Pat of Breckenridge and Mr. 
and Mrs. C. B. Mowry of Iowa 
Park spent the week end in the 
Millard McSwain 'lame and with 
other relatives here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Moeller and 
Mickey of Minden, La., are vis-
iting their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Rodgers and Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Moeller in Haskell, this 
week. 

Mr. and Mrs. • Parnell Skelton 
attended the funeral of Mrs. John 
D. Kilcrease in Henrietta Friday. 

Visiting with Miss Burniece 
Goode Saturday was her niece 
and husband, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Duncan of Plainview. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Jo Cunning-
ham and family of Electra vis-
ited with Mr. and Mrs. G. 0. Den-
ham Sunday afternoon. 

Miss Mozelle Vandever of San 
Angelo spent the week end visit-
ing her mother and sister, Mrs. 
S. E. Vandever and Nina. 

Miss Zoe Moore and Ralph and 
Partin Wakefield of Bryan visit-
ed Miss Moore's parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. H. W. Moore, last Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Phillip Struck 
and family spent the week end 
visiting his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Aubrey .S truck and family in 
Weatherford. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Lain, Chad 
and Cynthia and Mr. and Mrs. W. 
C. Morton spent the week end 
with relatives" in Ft. Worth." 	. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Beaty ac-
companied Mrs. Ailyn Laws and 
Grady Mack of - Seymour to Mid-
land for a week end visit with 
Miss Ruth Ann Beaty and Mrs. 
Eva Godfrey and family. 

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Oran Chamberlain over 
the week end were their daugh-
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
FL Therwanger, Randy, Lindy 
and Terry Dean, of Fort Worth. 

Mrs. J. L. Hunter visited last 
week in the J. E. Nelson and Wel-
don Floyd homes in Munday and 
in the J. E. Hunter home in Knox 
City. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Peterson 
spent the week end with her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Sanders, 
and other relatives in Irving. Mr. 
Sanders has been real sick but 
is reported to be improving. 

Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. C. 
A. Williams and family Sunday 
were her sisters, Miss Linda Kay 
Gresham of Denton and Mr. and 
Mrs. Leon-Watson and family of 
Knox City. 

Mr. and Mrs. L. L. Atkinson 
and Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Moore 
spent the week end with Mr. and 
Mrs. William Atkinson, Gaylon 
and Janie in Kress. Other visitors 
in their home Sunday were Mr. 
and •Mrs. Lewis Atkinson, Lub-
bock; Mr. and Mrs. John Shrop- 
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shire, Vanessa and Kerry, New 
Deal; Mr. and Mrs. Fred Jones, 
Floydada; Mr. and Mrs. John 
King, Plainview; and Mr. and 
Mrs. Junior McNally, Judy and 
Vicki of Kress. 

Weekly Health 

LETTER 
Issued by the State 
Health Department 

the week end with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dewey Struck and 
family. 

Mrs. George Stambaugh spent 
several days last week with her 
daughter, 'Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mc-
Cracken and family, in Wichita 
Falls. 

Mr. and Mrs. A. A. Brooks 
spent the week end with their 
daughter and husband, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Barron in Graham. 
They went on to Ft. Worth this 
week for Mrs. Brooks to have 
a medical check-up. 

Mrs. Grace Reid and her aunt, 
Mrs. Joe Cooper, of Haskell vis-
ited Mrs. I. J. Troy Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orb Coffman 
spent the week end with their 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Dan Davis and children in 
Lubbock and other points on the 
plains. 

Rev. Jesse Dae will do the 
preaching in a revival in Silver- 

Sunday and Monday. 
Mr. Heard Crouch of 'Albuquer-

que, N. M., visited his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. George Crouch, Sat-
urday. Ile was enroute to Wich-
ita Falls for two weeks visit. 

Mrs. W. L. Thornton and Mrs. 
Mack 'Lyrics visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Thornton in Glen Rose 
last week Mrs. Thornton remain-
ed for a longer visit with her son 
and wife. 

Mr. J. D. Lankford visited his 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. H. E. Lank-
ford and famil y, in Ardmore, 
Oka., Monday. 

Miss Laverne Hattox of Lub-
bock spent the week end with 
Judy Blankenship and other 
friends here. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Kirkpatrick 
of Midland spent the week end 
with his sister, Mrs. Nell Har-
grove, and his brother, Mr. Roy 
Kirkpatrick. 

Ronnie Struck of Cisco spent 

the hunter from wildlife. 
Proper fire-arm care and clean-

ing are vitally important. A speck 
of rust or dirt in the delicate 
mechanism may trigger an un-
expected discharge, barrel erup-
tion or other mishaps. 

Maneuvering b a rbed-wire 
fences poses less problem for the 
hunter if a companion holds the 
gun. Otherwise, the rifle should 
be placed carefully on the ground 
while the hunter climbs through 
or over the fence. 

The hunter who "thinks b ite 
sees-a-turkey" and shoots with-
out -determining absolutely, pro-
nounces a pqssible death sentence 
for some person. 

Ideally, the sportsman returns 
home with bag-of-game in hand. 
Fatigued or not, his responsibili-
ties aren't ended. Cleaning and 
storing the fire-arm away from 
the hands of children -- ammu-
nition in a separate place of 
course—completes the event. 

Mr. and Mrs. Foster Kelly and 
Richard of Wichita Falls spent 
the week end with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Kelly and 
David and Mr. and Mrs. Woody 
Roberts and family. 

Mrs. Mary Moore returned to 
her home in McCamey Sunday 
after visiting for several days 
with relatives here and with her 
uncle, Frank ,Cowsar in Gaines-
ville_ 

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Donoho 
and Kathy of Wichita Falls vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. D. R. Donoho 
Sunday. 

Mrs. John Bates visited her mo-
ther, Mrs. J. C. Rice, in Haskell 
last Wednesday. 

Mrs. Jack Builderbaelz of 
Quanah visited her mother. Mrs. 
Scytha Parmley and Mr. and 
Mrs. W. M. Yates and Sandra, 

AUSTIN — Know how many 
hunters there are in Texas? Im 
agine a city the size of Dallas 
and each resident a Nimrod, gun 
in hand, ready for the hunt. This 
is the picture. 

To the hunter, fall has special 
significance. Dove season open-
ed September 1 in north zones 
and October 1 in south zones. 
Deer and turkey seasons follow, 
opening November 16. During 
these months — September 
through December — statistics 
show a rise in accidental fire-arm 
deaths. In a year's time, a total 
of 184 persons die from accidents 
with guns. 

Some hunters never live to 
enjoy the season. In the last 
three year; 38 died•cleaning and 
handling guns, perhaps in antici-
pation -of opening day. Twenty-
four died transporting fire-arms 
into the field. 

Theoretically, a gun is not dan-
gerous itself. But in the hands of 
an inexperienced, unskilled per-
son it becomes a deadly weapon. 

Texans across the state recog-
nize this problem and are doing 
something about it. Some local 
health units and National Rifle-
man Association instructors 
work at the grass-roots—teach-
ing home gun safety to children. 

This is an excellent step in the 
right direction but there is no 
substitute for individual practice 
of fire-arm safety, with the hunt-
er consciously alert to the haz-
ards of gun handling from the 
time he dresses for the first hunt 
until he stores his rifle at the 
end of the season. 

Even his choice of hunting 
clothes is a factor in safety 
afield. Clothing ideally combines 
warmth, comfort and safety fea-
tures. Red or yellow outer gar-
ments and caps help distinguish 

EL-FOOD PRODUCTS 
Can Be Purchased At 

HALLMARK GRO. and STA. 
MORTON & WELBORN 
RODGERS FOOD MART 

LYNN ELECTRIC MOTOR CO. 
Jimmy Lynn, owner Knox City, Texas 

Day or Night Phone 658-5282 
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You Can Bank On Our 

Many Services! 1111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111 

Whether you come in to deposit your 
money, send it by mail, or use our night 
depository service, you can be sure that 

your money will be safe. 

Yes, banking here is safe and con- 

venient. We're ready to h e 1 p you with 

your banking problems, giving you every 

service consistent with good banking. 

The First National Bank 
In Munday 

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation 

Field Seeds 
We have a complete stock of seed— 

Cimarron oats, Balbo oats, Early Tri- 
umph wheat, hairy vetch, Austrin winter 
peas, Texas alfalfa seed. 

For treating seeds, we have Parson's 
Seed Saver. 

We have plenty of bulk turnip seed. 
Your patronage will he appreciated. 

S. L. WHITE AND SON 

GRAIN CO. 
Knox City, Texas 
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ELECTRIC 1101011 IN11111 
Sales and Service for A. 0. Smith, Rob- 
bins & Myers and Westinghouse Motors 

JACUZZI PUMPS 
Sales and Service 

We Repair All Makes Motors and 
Jet Pumps ... 

Pictured above are, top row, 1. to r.: James Craig, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. James Morris, and Perry, son of Mr. and Mrs. Everett 
Kuehler; bottom row: Melissa and Lou Cartwright, children of Mr. 
and Mrs. Alonzo Cartwright. 

ASSOC  SUBSCRIPTION RATES 

In first zone, per year 	 2.50 

In second zone, per year 	 3.50 

• 

The Stunday Times Is Democratic, yet supporting only what it 
believes to be right, and opposing what it believes to be wrong, 
regardless of party policies, publishing news fairly, impartially. 

NOTICE TO TFIE PUBLIC: Any erroneous reflection upon the 
character, standing, or reputation of any person, Finn or cor-
poration which may appear In the columns of this paper. wilt 

be gladly corected upon due notice being given to the publisher, 
at the Blunday Times office. 

The period from October 6.12 
has been designated as National 
Fire Prevention Week by Presi-
dent Kennedy. He has asked every 
citizen of the nation to support 
local programs aimeed at reduc-
ing !frees. The Texas Farm and 
Ranch Safety Council urges rural 
families to join in the program. 

timmints 
A smart 

change of 
pace! 

PeA•Part 
BREAD 

P. S. Serve it Hot! 
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CLEAN, MODERN 

How to have a "builtom" gas kitchen 
without the cost of remodeling! 

This is the new gas model that fits snugly against the wall 

`to .line up with your kitchen counters and cabinets. Gives 
a built-in look to any kitchen. Burners pull out at a touch. 
When they're hidden, a handsome hardwood cutting board 

(is all you see. Oven and broiler are at eye level, and the 
broiler is absolutely smokeless (because it's gas!). Notice 

the controls are high — and mighty handy. Burner-with- i  
la-Brain, Cook 'n' Keep oven, self-basting rotisserie 
t these and other automatic features will modernize your, 
!cooking as well as your kitchen. There are eight gasi  
orange brands in this design ... 
and they're on sale — so now is 
the time to buy! See your Gas 

'Appliance Dealer or Lone Star Gas. COOL, AUTOMATIC 

a 

Look! 
We give DOUBLE S&H GREEN STAMPS every Wed-

nesday on all purchases amounting to $3.00 or more, exclud-
ing cigarettes. 

RODGERS FOOD MART 

MRS BAIRDPS 
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EVERYBODY CAN HELP 
More and more people agree the United way is the best way. When 

you give United, you give once, just once a year, and support every es- 
sential community service. 

THE 
UNITED 
WAY... 

You make sure these services are always 
available where and when they are needed: It's 
up to you to give United; give all you can to 
help all! Welcome your Volunteer worker! 

The young and the aged, the sick and the 
handicapped, the victims of disaster . . . so 
many fellow Americans in need benefit from 
your one contribution, when you give the 
United Way through the United Community 
Campaign. 

October 8 Is U Day 
United Community Campaign work e r s 

will be calling at your home or place of busi- 
ness to solicit your support—We urge you to 
contribute generously. 

Munday's $5,400 udget For 1964 Includes: 
Muscular Dystrophy 	 
Salvation Army 	 
American Red Cross 	 

(Bloodmobile expense included) 

Boy Scouts (Northwest Texas Council) 	$750.00 
Girl Scouts (Nor-Cen-Tex Council) 	$700.00 
Texas United Funds   $550.00 

	$200.00 
	$750.00 
	$700.0.0 

11111 	11111 
UNITED 

City-County Library 	 ___ _$750.00 
Summer Youth Program   	$600.00 

(Boys Baseball and Girls Program) 

City Park Improvement   $200.00 
United Community Funds—Campaign Expenses $200.00 

(Advertising and Supplies) 

TOTAL BUDGET 	 $5,400.00 

..Give United It Helps! 
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NEWS FROM VER,A said, "growers having questions 
about the 1964 program are en-
couraged to call ,at the ASS' 
county office, and our people wit 
do their best to answer them. 

(Mrs. Thelma Lee Coniston) 

Mrs. Lanetta Hewett and chil-
dren of Abilene visited Thurs- 

day and Friday of last week with 
her father, Doss Jernigan, and 
Mrs. Eva Jernigan. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Wayne Feem-
ster and sons, Mike and Randy, 
of Abilene visited Saturday and 
Sunday with his parents, Mr. and 

ter 
rs-
ter 
ar-
Ier 
of 

ied 
gli- Research has shown that crop 

rotation, deep plowing and real-
due management are a combina-
tion of practices which will help 
cut cotton root rot losses. Deep 
plowing is most effective when 
done during a period of hot, dry 
weather. Christmas Toys 
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Our new selection of Christmas toys 
are arriving daily. 

Lay Them Away, Now! 
Use our lay-away plan and select 

your toys early. A small deposit will hold 
your selection, and you can have them 
paid out by Christmas. 
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"IF YOU'D KEPT ALERT FER SCREWWORMS LIKE THEM SCIENTIST.  
FELLERS SAID, OLE BLAZE WOULD STILL BE ALIVE!" 

YOUR 
NEWSPAPER 

PACKS 
SOO 
POWER! 7:: 

Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Warren 

rri leasitgv` 

WHITE AUTO STORE 

Wee fide* ens 

the program, the loan rate, sup-
port payment, and total national 
average support are, respective-
ly: Corn (per bu.), $1.10, 15 cents, 
$1.25; barley (per bu.), 84 cents, 
12 cents, 96 cents; grain sorghuth 
(per cwt.), $157, 23 cents, $2. 

Besides qualifying for price 
support loans and support pay-
ments, the grower who partici-
pates in the 1964 feed grain pro-
gram will earn a diversion pay-
ment on the acreage he shifts 
from feed grain production to a 
conserving use. 

While the 1964 program is 
basically the same as the suc-
cessful 1963 program, an impor-
tant change increases the top 
limit on diversion from a farm's 
base acreage and also increases 
the rate of payment for maxi-
mum diversion. In 1964, any pro-
ducer may divert as much as 50 
per cent of his feed grain base 
acreage (in 1963 it was 40 per 
ment): the maximum acreage di-
version will be 25 acres if this 
is more than 50 per cent of the 
base. Also in 1964, these produc-
ers who divert 40 per cent or 
more of the feed grain base acre-
age will receive diversion pay-
ments at the maximum rate for 
all acres diverted. 

"While all details of the 1964 
feed grain program have not yet 
been announced," the Chairman 

of Gilliland visited Monday with 
their son, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Kinnibrugh and Randal. 

Recent guests of Rev. and Mrs. 
Ray Foites and son were Mr. 
and Mrs. Russell Noble and Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarence Gregory and 
family of Ralls. 

Keith Hardin, accompanied by 
his roommate, Tommy Sloan of 
Rochester, visited Saturday with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Hardin and Billy. 

II 111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111  
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Now Open 
ELSEY'S 

Studio of Photography 

Children's Portraits, Adult Portraits 
Family Groups 

Weddings Commercials 

N  
Munday Mogul Lighters 
Famous Scripto Windguard 

Vu-Lighters with a 
Munday Mogul visible 

from either side. 
Scripto VU-lighters—let you know when 
the fuel is low. 

Each Mogul VU-lighter is lifetime guaranteed and has a 
permanent glass fibei wick that requires no service. Priced 
at only $3.95, Federal tax inc. 

Mrs. Jack Robertson of Dallas. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Feemster 

have returned home after spend-
ing the week with their daugh-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. George Parrish, 
in Houston. 

Week end guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. K. B. Ritchie were their 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Lamoine 
Ritchie and daughter, Renee, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Jo Parham 
and daughter of Lubbock. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Mc-
Gaughey visited a few days last 
week with their son, Rev. and 
Mrs. Ernest McGaughey and 
family in Garden City and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Brooks in Abilene. 

Mrs. E. C. Hardin has been re-
leased from the Baylor County 
Hospital and she and Mr. Hardin 
are spending a few days with 
their daughter, Mrs. W. T. 
Crouch and daughter in Sey-
mour. 

Clarence Allen of Abilene vis-
ited Monday with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Edd Allen, and Mrs. 
Jim Hughes. 

Mrs. J. M. Roberson accompan-
ed her son, Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Roberson of Truscott, to Dallas 
on Saturday to be with another 
son, Fred, who had surgery in a 
hospital there. 

Mr. and Mrs. Vance McMurry, 
accompanied by her sister of 
Leveiland visited briefly with 
friends here Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Townsend, 
accmopanied by her mother, Mrs. 
Roxie Morris, of Goree, visited 
Sunday with Mrs. Morris's neice, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. A. Vire in Abi-
lene. 

Mr. and Mrs. Amos Kinnibrugh 

Get Your Mogul VU-Lighter Today At 

Mrs. Lee Feemster, and Mrs. 
Spinks. 

Mrs. Floyd Trussell of Dallas 
spent the week end with her 
granddaughter, Miss Pamela Pat-
terson, in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Loran Patterson and fam-
ily. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Tomlinson 
and son, Phil, of Benjamin were 
Sunday visitors in the home of 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Wiles and boys. 

Pvt. Lonnie Forbes of Shep-
pard Field Air Base visited over 
the week end with his parents, 
Rev. and Mrs. Ray Forbes, and 
Tommie. 

Mr. and Mrs. Truman Holcomb 
of San Angelo visited Friday 
bhru Sunday in the home of her 
mother, Mrs. J. D. Jefcoat. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claudell Bratcher 
attended the Seymour - Bowie 
Football game in Bowie last Fri-
day evening and visited with her 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Finnis 
Bratcher and children. 

Mrs. Lois Sullins and Mrs. R. 
E. Hughes were business vis-
itors in Wichita Falls, last Satur-
day. 

Mrs. Henry Patterson was in 
Wichita Palls last Wednesday to 
be with her daughter, Mrs. Reba 
Nix, of Munday who underwent 
minor surgery in the General 
Hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Brown and 
sons, Donnie Mac and Billy 
Floyd, have been spending a few 
days in the home of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Wiles and 
boys. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Roberson 
returned home Friday after 
spending a few weeks at Wayside 
attending to business. 

Mrs. Charles Roberson and 
children of Norman, Okla., spent 
the week end with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Rube Richard, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Roberson. 

Recent visitors in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Quel Hughes .and 
girls were Mr. and Mrs. Tony 
Trubenbach of Muenster. 

Mrs. W. P. Hurd left last-
Thursday for Brownfield where 
she will visit for a few days in 
the home of her son, Mr. and 
Mrs. Howard Hurd. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. H. Martin of 
Marguarete visited recently in 
the home of Rev. and Mrs. Ray 
Forbes and son. 

Week end guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jess T)atinham were Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Willis of Brown-
field. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Hodges 
of. Lawton, Okla., visited last Fri-
day with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Carlo Kuchan. 

Week end visitors 	the Paul 
Weiss home were their children, 
Gary Wayne of North Texas Uni-
versity in Denton nad Mr. and 

We handle Heirloom frames, as ad- 
vertised in Vogue and House Beautiful. 

A. L. Smith Drug 
The REXALL Store 

Sam Elsei, Photographer 
827 Main St,. Munday 

Next door to Bud's Beauty Bar "Get It Where They've Got It" 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 
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Price Support 
On Grain Program 
Same As In 1963 

Price support for corn, grain 
sorghum, and barley in 1964 will 
again be made available through 
both leans and support pay-
ments, 0. E. Moore, Chairman, 
Agricultural Stabilization a n d 
Conservation County Committee, 
pointed out today. Growers will 
qualify for the supports by par-
ticipating in the 1964 feed grain 
program, for which the signup 
period is planned for early next 
year. 

The total national average 
price support levels for the three 
feed grains in 1964 will be the 
same as in 1963, the Chairman ex-
plained, but a slightly larger pro-
portion of the support will be 
made available through loans. As 
last year, .the loan rate will vary 
according to counties. The sup-
port payment for each of the 
three grains, however, will 'be the 
same amount per bushel in all 
counties. 

For the feed grains covered by 111)11111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111i111111111111111111111111  



ARMY FATIGUE 
WHITE PAINTER 
STRIPPED CAPS 19c 

BATES QUEEN ELIZABETH 
REDUCED 

Men's "Hanes" Knit 
Briefs-Tee Shirts 

Broadcloth 

SHORTS 1.00 val. 	69c 
CLOSING OUT MEN'S 3.95 and $3.50 
SHORT SLEEVE 

SPORT SHIRTS 	1.99 
mmmismmmmlmlk. 

MEN'S 5.95 and 6.95 MILLERS 

WESTERN SHIRTS 	4.44 

WESTERN SHIRTS . 	3.57 

STOCK UP FOR FALL WEAR 

MEN'S 4.50 and 4.95 MILLERS 

MEN'S 3.95 and 4.95 WASHABLE 
LONG SLEEVE - 1 and 2 POCKETS 

SPORT SHIRTS 	
 
2.94 

59c and 69c Values 

MEN'S HOB MOB 59e VALUE 

WORK GLOVES 37c pr. 

MEN'S E&W WHITE 

DRESS SHIRTS 	1.88 
100% Cotton $2.98 Value 

CLOSING ?HEN'S 
B. liiiirJARETS 

4.99 
Odd Lot Broken Sizes 
MEN'S DRESS 

PANTS Val. to 8.95 1..94  

10EA3U1 X1[4rAFANTS 	3.97 

GRAY and OLIVE 
Sizes 34 to 46 
59.95 Value 

MEN'S W. L. DOUGLAS & WALKER SHOES 
MEN'S W. L. DOUGLAS 

LOAFER $10.95 Value 	8.88 

MEN'S 15.95 W. L. DOUGLAS 

OXFORDS and LOAFERS 	13.88 

MEN'S WALKER BRAND 

WORK SHOES 6.95 Value 	4.88 

MEN'S WALKER BRAND 

WORK SHOES 8.95 Value 	6.88 

JONATHAN-LOGAN-MARCY LEE 
TONI TODD & VICKY VAUGHN 

New Fall DRESSES Reduced 
10.95 val. now 8.88 25.00 val. now 18.88  
14.95 val. now 11.88 32.50 val. now 22.88 

17.95 LADIES DRESSES 	13.88  

New Fall COATS Reduced 
17.95 LADIES COATS 	now 13.88 

22.50 LADIES COATS 	now 16.88 

32.50 to 45.00 LADIES COATS now 23.88 

59.95 LADIES COATS 	now 42.88 

BOYS & GIRLS WEAR 
BOSS & GIRLS HOODED 

Jackets 4.98 val. 	3.88 
BOY'S WASHABLE HOOD 

Jackets 6.95 val. 	4.94 
BOY'S 

I")°9";LTI.E 

 D LINED 
Jackets .95 va 	6.88 
BOY'S 2 to 8 COW BOY 

Boots 4.98 val. 	 3.44 
BOY'S 8 1/2  to 8 COWBOY- 

, Boots 7.95 )11, 	4.88 
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KAY'S DEPT. STORE Munda3 

ARDI.ES QF cosis O1 LOSSES 

DOOR UTERI 

80 Square 
45e BROWN 

Sheeting 

24c yd. 

1E NEVE fig,511 

DOOR MIER; 

$1.50 FOAM 

Pillows 

69c 

DOOR NAM/ 

MEN'S 59c 

Briefs 

29c 

MEN'S 49c 
UNDER 

Shirts 

29c 

WASH 

Cloths 
6 FOR 

39c 

70x80-3.56 
INDIA'S 

Blankets 

1.99 

MEN'S 69c 
BRopAcLont 

Shorts 

39c 

• 

LADIES FURNISHINGS 
SHIP N SHORE BLOUSES 

2.98 Blouses 	1.97 
3.98 Blouses 	2.97 
4.98 & 5.98 Blouses 3.97 
ENTIRE STOCK OF SUMMER 

PURSES „ 1/2 OFF 
LADIES 1.00 VALUE 	------ 

HALF-SLIPS 	44c 

WOMEN'S SHOES 

2.98 Ladies Flats 	1.99 

2.98 Suede & Leather 1.99 
COMBINATION FLATS 

WOMEN'S 3.98 
SUEDE and LEATHER 

FLATS .2.88 
WOMEN'S HI-HEEL RED LEATHER 

SHOES 7.95 val. 	5.88 

MISC. ITEMS REDUCED 
81x108 GARZA 

BED SHEETS 	1.88 
3.98 CHENILLE BED 

Spreads full bed size 2,44 
BATH MATS AND 

Bat Mat Sets 3.98 val. 2.44 

32.50 Bed Spreads 23.99 



DOOR %ICIER 

ENTIRE STOCK OF MEN'S 
DRESS PANTS - REDUCED 

4.98 wash n  wear Casuals 3.97  

14.95 Dress Pants  	11.88 

10.95 Dress Pants 	7.88 

5.50 and 7.50  Dress Pants 3.99 

iiii
N'S 

 S 
FANCY

HIRTS 	1.77 
SORRY NO ALTERATIONS 

3500 YARDS OF 
PIECE GOODS Reduced 

QUADRIGA-FRUIT 
OF THE LOOM 

COTTONS 	44c yd. 
59c VALUE 

SPECIAL GROUP OF 
WASHABLE LUXURY 

COTTON FABRICS 
SHANTUNG 
AND SILKS 

1.98 VALUE 

1.37 yd. 
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y Sale Starts Friday, Oct. 4th Doors Open 9a.m. 
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80 Square 

Prints 
49c Vaine 
4 YARDS 

1.00 

20x40 Cannon 
for BATH 

Towels 

37c 
81x99 GARZA 

Sheets 

1.68 

ODD LOT 
MEN'S DRESS 

Shoes 

2.94 
Broken Sizes  

CLOSING OUT 
150 LADIES 

Skirts 
Values to $8.95 

1.00 

LEN'S $3.50 FLANEL 

;HIRTS 	1 .77 
L'EN'S 1334-oz. LONE STAR 

WESTERN JEANS ..2.44 
4EN'S $6.95 GOODYEAR 

TUBBER BOOTS 	4.88 
MEN'S ROUND HOUSE 10! ,oz. 

OVERALLS 	2.77 
STRIPPED OR SOLID BLUE  

CLOSING OUR SPECIAL GROUPE 

MEN'S SUITS 14 88  

All Sizes 
All Colors 
	 .88 

ARMY COMBAT BOOTS 
AND WORK SHOES 3.44 
Broken Sizes - Values to $8.95 

Special Group cf MEN'S 

OXFORDS and 4.88 
LOAFERS 
8.95 -VALI'E 	MUST GO AT 

MEN'S JACKETS REDUCED 
All New Stock 

$9.95 Men's Jackets 	$7.88  

$14.95 Men's Jackets 	$1L88  

$17.95 Men's Jackets 	$13.88  

$25.00 Men's Jackets 	$17.88 

3 BUTTONS ALL WOOL 
WORSTED-Broken Sizes 
Values up to $42.50 • 

MEN'S $22.50 end $27.50 1 

SPORT COATS 

ENTIRE STOCK OF NEW FALL & WINTER STOCK THROWN OUT ON THE ALTER OF SACRIFICE 

WHILE MDSE. WILL LAST - SO RUN -- WALK -- GRAB A TAXI BUT GET DOWN TO KAY'S DEPT. 

STORE, SALE STARTS FRIDAY, OCTOBER 4, AT 9 A. M. BE THE FIRST TO SAVE ON THIS SALE! 

MISC. MEN'S WEAR SACRIFICED 

9.95 Mens Slo Pokes Oxfords & Loafers 6.88 

12.95 ACME Wellington Boots 	10.88  
10.95 Walker  8-inch Work Boot  	7.88 

15.95 ACME Cowboy Boots 	12.88 
MEN'S WATER-PROOF DRESS 

Rain Coats 19.95 value 	14.88 
MEN'S WRANGLER 13 3/4 -oz. SANFORIZED 
LIGHT BLUE DENIM VAT DYED 

Western Blue Jeans 3.95 val. 	2.77 

MEN'S WRANGLER LIGHT BLUE DENIM 

Jackets 5.95 val. 	3.88 
MEN'S SCOTTS & MOWHAWK 
KHAKI OR GRAY SANFORIZED 3.50 VALUE 

PANTS  	2.44 

5'9c Men's Stretch Sox 39c  

125 Mens Corduroy Caps 77  

1.95 Mens Leather Caps 1 .44 

ilimmemmimmom  

Mens 3.95 MOC's now 2.97 
MEN'S 3.95 CASUAL 

Loafers and Oxfords 2.88 
MEN'S 3.93 

House Shoe 	2.88 
MEN'S BANDCRAFT DRESS-8.95 to 12.95 

Oxfords and Loafers 5.88 
MEN'S ACME 10.95 

Engineer Boots 	8.88 

CHILDREN'S DRESSES 
2.50 Value Now 	 1.88 
3.98 Value Now __ 	2.77 
4.50 Value Now 	 3.44 

CHILDREN'S ROBES 
3.95 Value Now 	__2.77 
4.95 Value Now __ 	 _ _3.44 

Ladies Summer Dresses 
13.95 & 14.95 Value Now ____7.44 
10.95 Value Now  	5.44 

NIMMOMOMMEENNEMEIMIM. 

LADIES 3.95 COTTON 

DUSTERS 	2.77 
LADIES COTTON 

DRESSES 	1.88 
LADIES 2.95 HOUSE 

SLIPPERS 	1.99 
ODD LOT LADIES 3.95 

FLATS 	1.99 
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To Be Married Odessa, students in A. C. C. in 
Abilene visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Chancey Hobert last Thursday. 

BEGINS TRAINING 
Mr. and Mrs. Oran Chamber-

lain took their son, Jerry Dan, to 
Wichita Falls on September 20, 
and he took a plane from there 
to Dallas and to Camp Pendleton, 
Calif., where he began his train-
ing in the U. S. Marine Reserves. 

Janie Blake of Texas Tech in 
Lubbock spent the week end with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
Blake. 

total amount of stock. If not own-
ed by a corporation, the names 
and addresses of the individual 
owners must be given. If owned 
by a partnership or other unin-
corporated firm, its name and ad-
dress, as well as that of each in-
dividual must be given.) 
Aaron Edgar, Munday, Texas. 
Grady Roberts, Wichita Falls, 
Texas. 

8. Known bondholders, mort-
gagees, and other security hold-
ers owning or holding 1 percent 
or more of total amount of bonds, 
mortgages or other securities, (If 
there are none, so state): The 
First National Bank, Munday, 
Texas. 

9. Paragraphs 7 and 8 include, 
in cases where the stockholder 
or security holder appears upon 

}he books of the company as 
'trustee or in any other fiduciary 
relation, the name of the person 
or corporation for whom such 
trustee is acting, also the state-
ments in the two paragraphs 
show the affiant's full knowledge 
and belief as to the circum-
stances and conditions under 
which stockholders and security 
holders who do not appear upon 
the books of the company as 
trustees, hold stock and securi-
ties in a capacity other than that 
of a bona fide owner. Names and 
addresses of individuals who are 
stockholders of a corporation 
which itself is a stockholder or 
holder of bonds, mortgages or 
other securities of the publishing 
corporation have been included 
in paragraphs 7 and 8 when the 
interests of such individuals are 
equivalent to 1 percent or more 
of the total amount of the stock 
or securities of the publishing 

STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP, 
MANAGEMENT AND 

CIRCULATION 
(Act of October 23, 1963; Sec- 

tion 4369; Title 39, United 
States Code) 
1. Date of filing: Oct. 1, 1963. 
2. Title of publication: The 

Munday Times 
3. Frequency of Issue: weekly. 
4. Location of known office of 

publication (Street, city, county, 
state, zip code): 706 Munday 
Ave., Munday, Texas - 76371. 

5. Location of the headquarters 
or general business officies of 
the publishers (Not printers): 
same: 

6. Names and addresses of pub-
Usher, editor, and managing edi-
tor: Publisher (name and ad-
dress Aaron Edgar, Munday, 
Texas; Editor: Aaron Edgar, 
Munday, Texas; Managing Edi-
tor: Aaron Edgar, Munday, Tex-
as. 

7. Owner (If owned by a cor-
poration, its name and address 
must be stated and also immedi-
ately thereunder the names and 
address of stockholders owning 
or holding 1 percent or more of 

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Glenn of 
Mesa, Ark., visited several days 
this week with her sisters, Mrs. 
Dee Allred and Mrs. Annie Floyd, 
and their families. 

(xx). 
2. Sales Through Agents, News 
Dealers, or Otherwise. 100 (x), 
100 (xx). 

C. Free Distribution (incuding 
samples) by Mair, Carrier Deliv-
ery, or by Other Means. 25 (x), 
25 (xx). 
D. Total No. of Copies Distribut-
ed. (Sum of lines Bl, B2 and C) 
1,535 (x), 1,525 (xx). 
(x) Average No. Copies each 
issue during preceding 12 months. 
(xx) Single issue nearest to fil-
ing date. 

I certify that the statetnents 
made by me above are correct 
and complete. AARON EDGAR, 
Publisher. 

Mrs. Chancey Hobert and Mrs. 
Lee Roy Leflar visited Mrs. Ho-
bert's daughter, Miss Shirley Mc-
Carty, at A. C. C. in Abilene on 
Tuesday of last week. 

Miss Suzanne Hightower of 
Texas Tech in Lubbock was a 
week end guest of her aunt and 
uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bailey 
King. 

Rev. and Mrs. Carl Pool of the 
Four Square Church 	Weinert 
were guests in the Ed Gates 
home last Sunday. 

YOUNG TEXAN FOR SEPTEMBER' 
Boyer Seale, a 17-year-old 

Senior and third string quarterback at 
Pori Arthur's Thomas Jefferson High 

,School, has been chosen by Texas 
Optimist Clubs to receive the Troy V. 

,Post Award and to be designated 
"Young Texan of the Month" for 
September. Young Seale, who has 
aspirations in the field of medical re-
search, is an honor student as well as 

ia football player. On the Straight A 
'Honor Roll for all of his high school 
years, he is a member of the National 
Honor Society and spent two months 
this summer in Colorado College at 
Colorado Springs, Colo., on a Na-
tional Science Foundation Summer 
Science Training Scholarship. He is 
also an Eagle Scout, a class officer, a 
golfer, a musician and an amateur ge-
ologist. Upon graduation next Spring, 
he will attend either the University of 
Texas or Colorado College. As a 
winner of the Troy V. Post Award, 
aejs ilium, eligible for one of 
three valuable scholarships to be 
awarded monthly Young Texan win- .  

' ners at year end. Seale was chosen for 
the honor in competition with hun-
dreds of other nominees by a panel 
of state leaders headed by U.S. Su-
preme Court Justice Tom C. Clark.' 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Canafax of 
Saint Jo visited Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Combs last Sunday. Mrs. Cana-
fax also visited Mrs. W. W. Wil-
son. 

J. A. Brewer of Wickett visit-
ed his riarents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Brewer, a few days last 
week. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Armstrong 
of Fort Worth visited his mother, 
Mrs. F a n n i e Armstrong, and 
other relatives over the week end. 

Mrs. M. L. Raynes and her 
father, R. S. Edwards of Weinert, 
attended the 5th Sunday singing 
convention in Rule last Sunday. 

omminimmimmiimmummmummum11111111111111111m1111111111111111 

T 13eot Wag flPINNWOMNI 
For 

hearty 
appetites! 

. . . to express your sentiments and best 
wishes to loved ones in the hospital is 
with cheerful, lovely arrangements of 
fresh flowers. 

Daily deliveries to the Knox County 
Hospital at 5 p.m. 

MUNDAY FLOWER SHOP 
813 Main St. 	 Phone 3151 

Hours: 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
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Mr. and Mrs. C. J. Albus, Rich-
ard and Gayland, visited their 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Kotulek and daugh-
ter, in Odessa over the week end. For Sale 

corporation. 
10. This items must be complet-

ed for all publications except 
those which do not carry adver-
tising other than the publisher's 
own and which are named in sec-
tions 132.231, 132.232, and 132.233, 
postal manual (Sections 4355a, 
4355b, and 4356 of Title 39, United 
States Code) 
A. Total No. Copies Printed (Net 
Press Run) 1,640 (x), 1,620 (xx). 
B. Paid Circulation 

1. To Term Subscribers by 
samples) by Mail, Carrier Deliv-

other means. 1,410 (x), 1,400 

MRS BAIRDPS The famous Chinese Silky 
bantams. PutA•Part 
M. H. Mansfield Miss Shirley McCarty and her 

roommate, Miss Judy Baker of 
,0 BREAD 

ES. Serve it Hot! 
Route One 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 
• 

TO YOU 2,1"zeria0../.04vse•••••,•,..•  •  • " 
... ' 	 4 	 • . 

Sunday School was well attend-
ed at all churches Sunday. 

Rev. L W. Wicks was at his 
post of duty Sunday morning at 
Saint John Church. 

The missionary union of West 
Beulah Baptist Church sponsored 
a program Sunday evening. Rev. 
I. W. Wicks and Brother V. Odis 
doing the preaching. Our hearts 
was made glad. In the meantime 
Brother Wilson and wife with 
their singers come in and sang 
out of their heart with Sister 
Wilson at the piano. 

On Sunday night they sang for 
the Saint John Church where 
Rev. Brother Odis was closing 
out the revival meeting. 

Mr. Ernest Williams of Wichita 
Falls visit his sister and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Milton Murry, on 
the week end. 

Mrs. Alta Fayc Johnson and 
Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Green and 
Mr. and Mrs. Butch Pry of 
Tatum Okla., visit Mrs. Pearlie 
Mae Thomas on the week end. 
Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Green was 
brother and sister-in-law of Mrs. 
Pearlie Mae Thomas. 

Mrs. Lear Thomas return 
home on the week end from visit-
ing her daughter and son-in-law 
in Lubbock. 

Please attend the church of 
your choice Sunday. 

Activities of The 
Colored People 

By Fannie Mae Johnson 
Mr. 'and Mrs. Raymond Pace 

of Goree are announcing the en-
gagement and approaching mar-
riage of their daughter, Patricia 
Ann, above, to James Howard 
Peek, son of Mr. and Mrs. Ho-
ward Peek, also of Goree. 

The couple will be married in 
the First Baptist Church in Go-
ree at 4 p.m. Sunday, October 20. 

Miss Pace is a 1963 graduate of 
Goree High School. The prospec-
tive bridegroom is a 1962 gradu-
ate of Goree High School and is 
presently employed at Train-
ham's Grocery and Market in 
Goree. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Killian and 
son of Lubbock visited their par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Faye Killiary 
and Mr. and Mrs. Jim Welch, and 
James over the week end. 

LOCALS 

MORE 

FROM INTERNATIONAL HARVESTER 

'64 Fairlanes . . . new family car with 
sports-car feel! Choice of 2 thrifty Sixes 
and 3 Texas-type V-8's--including the 

same basic engine that powers 
the Cobra to racing triumphs. 

• 
'64 Thunderbirds ... leader of our new 
Total Performance cars from Ford! Ra-
diantly restyled for '64. Smooth new ride 
suits Texans to a "T." 

wwm:Yrn;;” 	•C'sre'2VYtY."'";mr9-+-7r-r.y.,f**>i,if4Nixt-r-7:9,%,,,t—s-c7f—cer• 	 ,ye? TOTAL POWER 
110 H.P.* 

'64 Super Torque Fords ... solid, silent, simply sensa-
tional. Honed and improved by Ford victories in open 
competition. Beautifully built to stand up under our 
long-haul Texas driving. 

LI 

new line of born 
.winners just rolled 

cte7 

into Teas • 
the '64s from Ford! 

89 H.P. 

*Gross engint 
horsepower. 
Manufactureri?, 
estimate. 
at sea level, 
Ws temp. 

'64 Falcons . . . all-new compact with 
plush new ride, big-car style. Plus the 
optional 260 V-8 that brought Falcon 
best-of-class in the Monte Carlo Rallye! 
Test-drive a new '64 Ford, Fairlane or 

Falcon today! 

Dad! Sign up your boy in FORD'S 
PUNT, PASS & KICK COMPETITION 

Free for all boys 8 thru 11! Bring your boy 
in to the Ford Dealer displaying the PP&K 
sign. Free gifts for registering! Plus great 
prizes to winners in each age group! F.O.A.F. 

The people who bring you the machines that work 

H orton Equipment Co. TRY-10141 PERFORMANCE  AT WEIR  !ORD Dalin 
F. & J. Ford Sales 

Munday, Texas Your International Dealer 
830 Main St. Munday, Texas 	Phone 5631 



CHIROPRACTOR 
Munday, Texas Phone 4331 

Dr. Fidelia Moylette 

he. 

Office Hours; 
9-12 2.6 

a 

Office Closed 
on Thursday 

McCauley 
Funeral Home 

OXYGEN EQUIPPED 
AIR CONDITIONED 

AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Day Phone 	Nite Phone 
3451 	 3451 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 

Goree News Items 
Bryson 

The Goree Wildcats will play 
111117son at Bryson on Friday 
slat Oct., 4. This will be the 
Het conference game of the sea
stra 

- 

W. S. C. S. To .Beet 
The W. S. C. S. will meet each 

tratay morning at 9:30 at the 
First Methodist Church. 

Houston. 
Buster Kirk, General Huzipital, 

Wichita Falls. 
Mr. John Reed, who had been 

a patient in the Veteran's Hos-
pital in Big Spring for several 
weeks, was able to return home 
last Thursday. 

Mrs. J. W. Baughman, who un-
derwent eye surgery in the Beth-
ania Hospital in Wichita Falls. 
is back at home and recovering 
nicely. 

l in Megargel Saturday. 
Miss Lola Baughman and 

Frank Baughman of Moran have 
been visiting their brother and 
wife, Rev. and Mrs. J. W. Baugh-

' man, for several days. 
Mrs. Raymond Pace, Patricia. 

Margie and Thomas spent the 
week end with her daughter and 
husband. Mr. and Mrs. George 
Tucker, in Dallas. 

Mrs. Benny Hagan attended 
the \S'. M. U. district leadership 
workshop in Abilene last Friday. 

Rev. Benny Hagan assisted 
with the funeral of Rev. J. C. Pel-
trey at the East Side Baptist 
Church in Cisco Friday morning. 

Recent visitors in the Wesley 
Kinman home were his brother. 
Mr. and Mrs. E. 0. Kinman and 
family of Ft. Worth and their 
son. Mr. and Mrs. Charles Don 
Kinman and Jeff of Wichita 
Falls. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gordon Smith of 
Munday and Mr. and Mrs. Doug-
las Smith spent the week end 
with Mrs. Smith's sister and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Claude Men-
ges in Dallas. Enroute home they 
visited another sister and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Melton 
and Margie, at Garner. They also 
visited with Mr. Smith's aunt, 
Mrs. Gilbert Corley, in Olney. 

Mrs. Willard Kilgore of Benja-
min spent the week end with her 
sisters, Mrs. Zela Hayes and Mr. 
and Mrs. Woody Roberts and 
family. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Justice 
spent the week end with his sis-
ter and husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Albert Lee in Alvord. They also 
attended the Wise County sing- 
ing 	convention in . Zion Valley 
Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cordas Ray Lam-
beth and family of Wichita Falls 
spent the week end with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Felton 
Lambeth and Mrs. W. E. Blan-
kenship and family. The Lam- 

New Time Schedule 
'ago ping Sunday night at the 

not Baptist Church the preach-
ing service will begin at 7 o'clock 
ft. ttcsd of 7:30. Training Union 
oat begin at 6:00 o'clock. 

Staff Members Named 
Staff Members for the sloe! 

paper -Wildcats' Claws" have 
been named. Editor is Terry Pat-
terson; asst. editor, Donny Land' 
high school editor, Jan Roberts; 
sports, Dickie Green and Eileen 
Coffman; 

Grade school editor, Robbie 
Cooke; song dedications and gos-
sip. Ted Machen and Lynelle Jet-
ton; jokes, Kenneth Struck; cal-
endar, Roy Lee Russell; art, King 
Ilardeman. 

Annual Staff 
•September 16, 1963, the annual 

staff held Its first meeting. This 
year the staff cow:ha ,: of  5 sen- 

Birthday Dinner Honors Three 
A h:rthday dinner in the Tom 

Cloud home Sunday honored 
Mrs. Larry Wilson of Hale Cen-
ter an .I Tommy and Judy Cloud 
on their birthdays. 

Attending the dinner were, Mr. 
and Mrs. -Lan-y Wilson and fam-
ily, Hale Center; Mr. and Mrs. 
Gene Sbacklesfoni, Stamford; 
Mr. and Mrs. J. A. Hill, Sr., Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Sargent and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. J. A. Bill 
Jr., and family and Clint Ward-
law. all of Munday. 

Ise drops as sweet as ono 
leaspoonful of sugar without 
the calories' Plastic purse-
size squene•a•drop bottle. 
Economical. 

Mr. Eldon NleSwain received 
word last Friday that his half-
brother, Buman Grossman of An-
drews, had suffered a heart at-
tack and was critically ill in an 
Amarillo hospital. Mr. NIcSwain 
and Millard left immediately to 
visit his brother. 

Mrs. J. D. Lankford visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank McNally, Jr., 

Hand Drug Store 

Mrs. Malcom .D ea r man. Los 
Angeles, Calif.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Vick Swope and Brett, Anahauc: 
Mr. and Mrs. H. R. Shelly and 
family, Tuscola; Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobbie? Cypert and family. Odes-
sa; Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Doyle and 
family, Ft. Worth; Mr. and Mrs. 
Harlan Houk. Crowley; Mr. awl 
Mrs. Chet Swope and Jerry, Wil-
son; Mrs. Judy Walker and Tracy 
and Mr. and Mrs. Toby Cooke 
and baby, Abilene; Mr;. Marna 
Dean Porter and chlldrea. Lub-
bock; Mr. and Mrs. Louis Fin-
cannon and baby. Hamlin; Mr. 
and Mrs. N. E. Hosea and Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Hosea and fam-
ily, Munday; and Mr. and Mrs. 
C. D. Swope, Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Swope and Don and Mr. and 
Mrs. E B. Hosea and Brad of 
Goree. 

Mrs. L. E. Hunter was honored 
on her birthday Saturday with a 
handkerchief shower. 

los, 5 juniors, 2 sophomores and 1 
freshman. 

Officers elected were, editor, 
Jan Jones; asst. editor, Terry 
Patterson; business manager, 
Jane Carl; art editors, Jerry 
Decker and Eileen Coffman; 
sports editor, Bobby Beaty and 
Joyce Beaty; calendar. Jan Rob-
erts; photographer, Elva Panel-
ano; faculty. Beverly Harlan; 
classes. Vera Mae Russel; activi-
ties, Cynthia Lain; favorites, San-
dra Yates and sponsors, Mr. 
George Cotton and Mrs. Patsy 
Cooper. 

F. IL A. Meets 
The Goree F. H. A. Chapter 

!met Sept. 17. ant-elected officers 
for the coming year. Mrs. Patsy 
Cooper presided _at the meeting 
until the new president, Carol 
Jackson, was elected. 

Other officers elected are: vice 
president, Cynthia Lain; secre-
tary, Sandra Yates; treasurer, 
Jane Carl; reporter, Lynell Jet-
ton; historian, Joyce Beaty; par-
liamentarian, Carolyn Shahan; 
song leader, Janey Trainliam and 
Vera Mae Russel; pianist, Shirley 
Struck; sargeant-at-arms. Robbie 
Cooke; beau. Donny Land and 
sponsor, Mrs. Patsy Cooper. 
After the election, refreshments 
were served. 

The chapter met on Tuesday, 
September 24. to install the new 
officers. Jan Roberts served as 
installing president. After the in-
stallation a short business meet-
ing was held. The chapter will 
meet each second and fourth 
Tuesday of the month. 

------- 
Pollack-Swope Reunion Sunday 

The Pollack-Swope reuninn 
was held Sunday in the memorial 
building in Goree with 58 persons 
attending. 

Those attending were, Mr. and 
Mrs. Donk. Swope and baby. 
Santa Susan, Calif.; Mr. and 

111.01tad Notes 
Sat Elliott, Anderson Hospital 

To 

• I  . 

EXCITING NEW GAME 

HUNDREDS of WINNERSown 
Collect 

All Eleven 
PLAYERS 

Extra Point Wins . . . . . $1 
Safety Wins . ..... . $5 
Field Goal Wins . . . . . $10 
Touch Down Wins . . $25 

SY M SUP =fit MARKE 

WATCH FOR OUR 4 ME COLOR CIRCULAR 

FOR MANY SUPER MONEY SAVING FOOD VALUES 

beth family and Mrs. Blenken-
i ship. Shirley and Pat visited Sun-
1 day with Mr. and Mrs. Taylor 
Allen and Kevin. 

Mrs. Julius Keuhler of Born-
arton visited Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Orsak Tuesday. Other visitors in 
their home this week were Mrs. 
Frank Stienback of Rhineland, 
Mrs. G. W. Redwine of Dumas, 
Mrs. Elmer Hutchens, Mrs. C. W. 
Lain, Mrs. Walter Mooney and 
Mrs. Emma Schumacher, also of 
Rhlneland. 

Slit.tes Alice Thornton and La 
Quits. Huckabe of Lubbock spent 
the week end with Alice's father, 
Mr. V3I1 Thornton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Glasgow, 
who have been visiting relatives 
here for the last two weeks, re-
turned to their home in Rosewell, 
N. M., Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. S. R. Hudson and 
Ray spent the week end with 
their daughter and famiy, 
and Mrs. Tommy Hattox and 
Lynette in Irving. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 
Hutchens and Allan last Thurs-
day were Mrs_ Hutchens' sister 
and husband, Mr. and Mrs. Char-
lie Cape of Paint Rock, and her 
mother, Mrs. G. W. Redwine of 
Dumas. Mrs. Redwine remained 
for a longer visit with her daugh-
ter and family. 

Misses Jo Ann Estes and Ear-
linda Alexander of ‘Veinert spent 
the week end visiting in Mona-
hans. 

Mrs. Wm. Hertel and sons of 
Seymour visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. E. A. Coffman, Satur-
day. 

tMore Goree On Page Two) 

CHAS. MOORHOUSE 
Cattle - Land - Insurance 

SIUNDAY PHONE 6811 	BENJAMIN PHONE 2181 

Insurance and Real Estate 
Fourth Block Nor It or Ford Dealer 

Wallace Moorhouse 
Phone 4051 	 Munday, Texas 

Now We Can All Play Footba 
FOR FUN AND VALUABLE PRIZES AT M-SYSTEM 

t 

'ERSONS UNDER 18 YEARS 
Of AGE ARE NON-ELIGIBLE 

Employee‘ of 3f.sy.tem and 
their immediate Families not 
eligible to win. 

ASK AT YOUR M-SYSTEM 

MUNDAY, TEXAS FOR COMPLETE DETAILS 



• LOCALS .1)1 man wish he could join me, if 
fighting the weather and insects 
and high costs looks like a hobby, 
I will accept this new status with 
all the grace befitting a man of 
my position in the society world. 

I figure if it helps the stand-
ing of a city man to be able to 
go out to his farm or ranch on 
the week end, it must send my 
rating over the top to be able to 
stay out here seven days a week 
the year around. 

There is a catch, however, and 
farming won't reach its full 
social standing until a farmer 
can say, Well, I think I'll go into 
town for the week end to check 
on my bank. 

Buy, Sell, Rent, Lease or Exchange It Through 	 Knox Prairie Philosopher Is Glad 
To Learn That Owning A Farm Helps 
In Improving ills Social Standing The Times Want Ads 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Bell of Lov-
ington, N. M., came in last Satur-
day for several days visit with 
her mother, Mrs. Kate Browning, 
and other relatives and friends. 

SFF US For picture framing. 
Many patterns of finished pic-
ture molding to choose from. 
George Beaty. 	 8-tic 

Editor's note: The Knox Prai-
rie Philosopher on his Johnson 
grass farm on Miller Creek dis-
covers he has a new standing, 
his letter this week reveals. 

* * * * 
Dear editar: 

In my time, I have called this 
Johnson grass farm a lot of 
things which you wouldn't be in-
terested in printing, but it was 
only last night I found out the 
correct thing to call it. 

Need Money? 

CLASSIFIED RATES 

First Insertion 	3c per word 

Following Insertions 2c per word 
Minimum Charge 	40c 

Classified Display ____60c per in. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Decker 
and son of Dallas are spending 
their vacation this week with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. A. M. 
Moore, Jr., and Mr. and Mrs. H. 
P. Decker. 

LIFE INSURANCE IS YOUR 
FINEST PROPERTY . . . 

Because: Life insurance is the 
o n 1 y investment designed to 
meet your needs, rather than 
the needs and the financial con-
venience of the company of-

fering it. 
PAUL E. PE?4DLETON, Agent 
Genl. American Life Ins. Co. 

J. A. Yours faithfully, 
J. A. 

Mr. and Mrs. Skip Cure and 
children of Lawton, Okla., were 
week end guests of his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Omar Cure. They 
also visited her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. L. C. Guinn, Jr., in Knox 
City. 

• 

—to-- 

BUY A FARM 

BUY A RANCH 

MAKE IMPROVEMENTS 

REFINANCING . . . 

Dr. Calvin Gambill 

minified 

FAR M 
LOANS —See— 

It's a status symbol. 
According to an article I read 

in a magazine, owning a farm 
or ranch is a status symbol, and 
a status symbol, as I understand 
it, is something to prove you're 
a notch ahead of somebody else, 
like white sidewall tires or a 
$6000 automobile that won't go 
any faster or smoother than a 
$2500 one. 

"With a growing number of 
city people, land ownerships is a 
status symbol," the article claim-
ed, adding that formerly a city 
man, when asked what he was 
going to do on the week-end, 
would say he was going to play 
golf, but now he says he's going 
out to his farm or ranch. This 
is supposed to add to his status; 
it proves he has luxurious tastes. 

Well now, while I'll admit I'd 
just as soon stay on this farm as 
play golf, I didn't know till now 
it was improving my social posi-
tion to do it. - 

However, if going up one row 
and down another on a tractor 
without springs makes me the 
envy of city people, if greasing a 
tractor makes a tired business 

.gr 

LET US TALK—To you about 
a new Krause plow. We also 
have a good stock of Krause 
parts. Egenbacher Implement 
Co., Knox City, Texas. 14-tfc CHIROPRACTOR 

Charles Baker 
—For A— 

John Hancock 
Farm Loan 

Office Hours: 
8:30 • 5:30 Mon. thru Sat. 

4I Low Interest 

if Long Term 

j Fair Appraisal 

1 Prompt Service 

FOR SALE — I always have 
stocker and feeder cattle listed 
for sale. Chas. Moorhouse. tfc 

NO 
LEFT 
TURN 

FOR SALE—Used furniture: 
chrome dinnette suite, iron bed 
and mattress, gas cook stove, 
space heater and dresser. Lo-
cated in retired Methodist 
preacher's house. If interested 
contact Charles Baker, phone 
6611. 	 ltc NOTICE FORD TRACTOR 

OWNERS — Let us overhaul 
your Ford tractor. Free pick-
up and delivery on major over-
hauls. Also we have several 
good used tractors for sale or 
trade. Gene Wood Tractor 
Sales, Munday, Texas. Phone 
3631. 	 24-tic 

TUxedo 8.3412 113 W. McLain 
Seymour, Texas 

GOREE LAUNDRY -- Has both 
wringer and automatic wash-
ing machines to better serve 
you. Why not give us a try? 
Automatic 20 cents per load; 
wringer type, 75 cents per 
hour. Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bailey; 
owners and managers. 13.3tc 

J. C. Harpham 
FURNITURE — New and used. 

Nationally advertised brands. 
Convenient terms can be ar-
ranged. McCauley Furniture 
Co. 	 20-tic 

Joe's Radio And 
TV Service 

The right turn when 
you're planning a move 

is to MOVERS in the 
YELLOW PAGES, 

where YOUR 
FINGERS DO 

iSS;HHE WALKING 

-  4 

INSURANCE 

51UNDAY, TEXAS 

WORRIED ABOUT TERMITFS 
—If so contact L. C. Searcey 
for free house inspection. 

41-tfc 
FOR SALE— 43 4-inch, 30 ft. 

sprinkler joints irrigation pipe; 
12 4x40 lateral joints irrigation 
pipe; 3 ells and other connec-
tions, sprinklers and rizers; 7 
pieces of Ford 3-point hitch im-
plements; one transport trailer 
for irrigation pipe. These to be 
sold by piece or all. J. R. 
Graham, Seymour, Texas. Also 
the farm owned by J. R. Gra-
ham, one and one-fourth miles 
northwest of Seymour to be 
sold by Bunkley and Jones. 
This farm is 136 acres, all in 
cultivation and level. 	13-6tp 

New Location 
So. 13th Ave. 

Same Phone Number 

REMEMBER — Dial 5471, Wm. 
Cameron & Co., for prompt 
service for all your building 
needs. Vim. Cameron & Co. 
Night phone 4041, Jimmie 
Cooke. 	 13-t fc 4641 

FOR SALE -- 2-bedroom house 
with den, carpet, curtains, elec-
tric stove and washer-dryer. 
Dwight C. Key. 	3-tfc LAND BANK LOANS — There's 

no better way to finance than 
with a Federal Land Bank loan. 
Low payments—up to 35 years 
to repay—no penalty for ad-
vance payments or payments 
in full. Federal Lank Bank of 
Haskell, Joe Harper manager. 
Offices at Haskell, Seymour, 
Anson. 	 25-tic 

Same Prompt Service KRAUSE PLOWS 	See us When 
in need of these plows or parts 
for your old plow. Egenbacher 
Implement Co., Knox City. 

14-tic 

SCHOOL SUPPLIES — We now 
have in stock 3 dozen pencils and 

pencil caddy for $1.95; clib-
boards in leatherette folders 
in green, blue and brown. Ideal 
for school. The Munday Times 
Office. 	 11-tic THREE YEARS — Finance plan 

available to you on new Inter-
national tractors and equip-
ment. Horton Equipment Co. 

6-tfc 

FOR SALE — New 3-bedroom 
home in Buillington addition, 
near completion. Phone 5471. 
Wm. Cameron & Co. 13-tfc 

SEPTIC TANKS — Pumped out 
Call 2936, Roe Allred, collect, 
Munday, Texas. 	33-tfc 

FOR SALE — Baled vetch and 
Rye. $1.00 per bale. Tom Cluck, 
Phone 6951. 	 12-tfc 

• • 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

V. 
•• 

• • 
NOTICE—We can pick up trac-

tors that need repairs. Horton 
Equipment Co. 	32-tic 

WALL TO WALL — Carpeting 
and linoleum. Ex per t work-
manship and popular prices. 
See us for any size job. Boggs 
Furniture. Phone 4171. 27-tfc 

WANTED—Repair loans. Up to 
15 years to pay. Wm. Cameron 
& Co., dial 5471. 	13-tfc 

ADDING MACHINE PAPER—
now in stock. 25c per roll 
standard size (25.32 in.) The 
Munday Times. 	38-tfc 

RADIO AND TV REPAIRS—
Bring us your radios and TV's 
for repairs. We repair any 
make or model, giving you 
prompt service. Strickland Ra- 
dice Service. 	 10-tfc 

FLASH-O-GAS — Soft Water 
Service. Phone 4671, Munday, 
Texas. 	 17-tfc 

THE BEST BUY ON EARTH 
IS THE EARTH! 

FARM AND RANCH LOANS—
Anywhere in Texas. None too 
large. Quick service. Try us. 

Wallace Moorhouse, Insurance 
Real Estate and Land Loans 

30-tfe 

coonniaard• * pa/Arai* 
FOR SALE—Hallmark's Grocery 

Store and Station. M. C. Hall-
mark, Box 674, Munday, -Texas. 
Phone 7771. 	 8-tfc DRAW COLOR A maraer with 

felt tip. Washable ink, non-
toxic, safe for children's use, 
39c. Advertised in Life. Now 
on sale at The Munday Times. 

44-tic 

• FOR SALE -- Two 3-bedroom 
houses. Mrs. Tommie Hall, 
phone 3921, Munday. 	12-tfc 

JanCharles Studios 
WE CARRY—A stock of genu-

ine Krause plows and parts. 
Egenbacher Implement Com-
pany, Knox City, Texas. 14-tfc 

NOTICE — Orders for "Early 
Days in Knox County," a book 
soon to be completed, may be 
sent to Mrs. R. D. Gray, Box 
393, Munday, Texas, 76371. The 
price is $3.75 plus 8 cent tax, 
add 15 cents postage for out of 
town. Those who paid $6.50 will 
receive a refund with your 
book. 7-tic  

FOR SALE — First year seed 
wheat. L. C. Franklin, 7 miles 
north of Munday. 	12-3tp 

FOR SALE — 1960 Ford station 
wagon. Air conditioned. New 
tires. Dwight C. Key. 	3-tfci 

FOR DRESSMAKING — And 
alterations, See Mrs. Floyd 
Searcey on Tuesdays and 
Thursdays only at The Fair 
Store. 	 51-tfc 

CHARLES G. CLARKE, OWNER ' PHONE 658-6391 * KNOX CITY, TEXAS 
aNOTICE—I will teach Baldwin 

organ music lessons in my 
- home after school Tuesdays 
through Fridays. Mrs. Owen 
New, phone 2411, Truscott, 
Texas. 	 9-tic 

FOR SALE—New Jacuzzi deep 
well pump, 1k HP. Used only a 
few hours. See Bud Offutt. 

12-2tp 

'64 Jet-smooth Luxury CHEVROLET BOSTON TERRIER—Stud serv-
ice. Third house east of Humble 
Service Station. Ralph Glass, 
phone 2286. 	 6-tfc 

c. 
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NOTICE — Coastal Bermuda 
grass sprigs for sale. Custom 
digging and custom sprigging. 
Reneau Farm, Phone 2051. 

42-tfc 

REGISTERED HEREFORDS —
Onward. Silver Mischief. 15 
bulls, 30 bred heifers, some 
calved, 2 and 3 years old. Priced 
to sell. Vern on Spraberry, 
phone, VA4-2130, P. 0. Box 727, 
Anson, Texas. 	11-3tp 

WANTED — A chance to figure 
your next plumbing or wiring 
job. No job too large or too 
small. Jack Clowdi s, phone 
5106. Plumbing and Electric 
Service. 	 44-tic 

SEED SEED SEED 
EARLY Triumph W h e a t, Kaw 

Wheat, Nortex and Mustang 
and Cimarron Oats, Vetch.— 
Cleaning and Treating Seed 
Daily. 

ALSO 
WE ARE now taking bookings 

on Cattle feed. Try us for your 
next Cattle feeds, Range Cubes, 
Breeder Cubes, Calf Creep 
Pellets, Special Mixed Feeds, 
Hull Mixes and Hog Feeds. We 
Deliver. 

Pied Piper Mills, Hamlin, Texas, 
Phone SP 4-1584. 	12-tfc 

FOR SALE — 3 
with garage. 
Munday, Texas 
ton, Goree, Te 

4 bedroom house 
410 13th Ave., 
. See Clyde Mot- 
xas. 	9-tfc 

CUSTOM STRIPPING — I have 
new Hesston brush type cotton 
stripper to do you a good job. 
Oscar Spann, phone 6767. 7-tfc 

FOR SALFr3 piece bedroom 
suite, French Provencial, solid 
walnut. Perfect condition. Mrs. 
Levi Bowden. 	12-tfc 

FOR SALE-5 H. P., three phase, 
constant speed electric motor. 
Worth the money. The Munday 
Times. 	 10-tfc 

NEED PAINT—And a painter? 
Phone Wm. Cameron & Co., 
dial 5471. 	 13-tfc 

FOR SALE—House, four rooms 
and bath. Good location. Con-
tact Joe Choucair at The Fair 
Store. 	 48-tfc 

WANTED—Reliable party with 
good credit rating to assume 
s m a 11 monthly payments on 
small Spinet piano in like new 
condition. Further information 
may be obtained by writing 
Dept. G., Box 1945, Wichita 
Falls, Texas, , 	12-2tc 

SEPTIC TANKS cleaned. Free 
inspection. Call 7751 collect, 
Munday, Texas. 	1-tfc 

GRANITE MONUMENTS — And 
markers. Monuments cleaned, 
also curb work. Large or small 
orders appreciated. Terms can 
be arranged. B & B Monument 
Works, Barnett and Busch, own-
ers, Box 89. phone PR 3-2211, 
Stamford, Texas. 	10-tfc 

NOTICE—We buy used tractors 
and equipment. Gene Wood 
Tractor Sales, phone 3631, 
Munday, Texas. 	39-tfe 

Title 1 

Repair Loans '64 Chevrolet Impala Sport Sedan 

Besides looks, ride and power- what's so special about it? 
For Home Repairs 

* Up to 60 Months to Pay! 

* No Down Payment! 

(it's so reasonably priced) 

Kind of leaves the high-priced cars some explaining to do, of four smooth transmissions to go with them. 
wouldn't you say? Long and luxurious—with a fresh- 	And underlying it all, the opulent feel of this '64 Chevrolet's 
christened look. Richer roomy interiors with subtle new Jet-smooth ride. 
blendings of colors and fabrics. Like the ultra-soft vinyl 	Matter of fact, the most noticeable difference between 
upholstery in the new Chevrolet Impala Super 	 this beautiful new 1964 Chevrolet and the high- 
Sport Series. 	 priced cars is the price itself. 

put all the way up to 425 hp.* And a choice 	 that reasonable Chevrolet price now buys. 
lieplional al ezira cost 

See five entirely different lines of cars at your Chevrolet Showroom—CHEVROLET, CHEVELLE, CHEVY II, CORVAIR & CORVETTE 

A choice of seven engines, no less, with out- 	 Let your dealer show you how much luxury CHEVROLET 

Charles Hogsett Chevrolet Company 
716 G Street 	 Munday, Texas 	 Phone 2231 

Munday Lumber Co. 



• 
People, Spots In The News 

• 

THE OSUNA TOUCH: Lith 
Osuna of Mexico shows up in 
lie won U.S. tennis singles ch 

e action of graceful Rafael 
this -"touch" volley shot as 

ampronship, 
sco,,wcx:msa•smaiESSORMIESSTESIXIMatb 

•••••: 
SUBWAY TARE' — This banquet ac-
tually is in what will be, 
new subway in Rotter- 
dam, 	

L\ 
Holland. Elegant, 

eh? 

WANNA LICK? Jimmy 
Bauer of North Platte, Neb. 
demonstrates what can be 
done with a stick o' licorice. 

GIANT nib of "Lifetime" k%.* 
fountain pen symbolizes ? 
golden anniversary of 
Sheaffer and reveals golden 
smile of Alexandra Devers. 

Dorcus Class Has 
Meeting Thursday 

The Dorcus Class met in the 
home of Mrs. Alice Lowrance 
on September 26 for a business 
and social meeting. 

Mrs. Bertha Fincannon, presi-
dent, gave the devoltional and 
led the opening prayer. Reports 
were read and new officers were 
elected. 	• 

Mrs. Joe Patterson read from 
the 15th chapter of Luke and 
then held a discussion. Mrs. A. U. 
Hathwaay led the closing pray-
er. 

• Refreshments were served to 
eleven members and one guest. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Machen 
spent last week end in Houston 
with their son and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lynn Machen and chil-
dren. 

Mrs. Agnes Mayes of Amarillo 
visited her mother, Mrs. Emma 
Mayo, hand other relatives over 
the week' end. 

Mrs. Cecil Barton of Amarillo 
was a week end guest of her sis-
ter and husband, Mr. and Mrs. H. 
A. Pendleton. 

Tony Hobert of Texas Tech in 
Lubbock spent the week end with 
his 'parents, Mr. and Mrs. Chal-
mer Hobert. 

Mr. and Mrs. George Spann 
and son of Euless are spending 

mrwmmvimmer 
Richer 
flavor! 
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• VALSPAR House Paint, per gal. 	 5.49 

• 1x6 Rough Pine Fencing 	 _9.95 

• 80 Rod Barbed Wire  	 6.69 

• Tools, Hand and Power 	__10% Discount 

• 4x8 1/2-Inch Bestwall Gypsum, sheet 	1.69 

• Wall Paper, val. to 3.50, per bolt _ _ _ _ _ 	___79c 

Many Other Money-Saving Specials 

OTHER SERVICES INCLUDE 

• Expert Planning and Complete Job Responsibility. 

False Advertising 
On Egg Cartons 

Have you ever taken an egg 
from a carton marked "All-Good 
Eggs" or "Ever-Fresh" and then 
had that egg ooze tiredly across 
the bottom of your skillet? 

That low quality egg might 
have been fresh three or four 
weeks ago but the carton may 
have led you to believe it was 
laid just yesterday. And it is just 
this sort of advertising on egg 
cartons that the Texas Egg Law 
is designed to prevent. 

One section of the law states 
that no descriptive terms imply-
ing freshness or high quality can 
be used on a carton unless the 
eggs actually are of A or AA 
grade. Cartons containing B 
quality eggs or lower, cannot use 
descriptive terms which might 
mislead the housewife. The Tex-
as Department of Agriculture in 
spectors maintain constant vigi-
lance to make certain the house-
wife gets what she pays for in 
eggs. 

When this law went into effect 
some six years ago, a number of 
ruses were tried to get around 
the misleading advertising clause. 
A few individuals attempted to 
pack under a company name 
which implied freshness such as 
"Top Quality Egg Company." ,or 
"Fancy Egg Company." One 

WELCOME TO 

THE 1963 

A 
FAIR,  

OF TEZAS 
OCT 5-20 

k********************* 

EXPOSITION OF OUR 
AMERICAN HERITAGE 

******************.*** 

FEATURING:  
BROADWAY MUSICAL 
"How To Succeed In Business 

Without Really Trying" 

"ICE CAPADES" ********************** 
PAN-AMERICAN 

LIVESTOCK EXPOSITION 
0 t 5.13,  

DEEP RIVER FIFE & DRUM CORPS 

HORSE SHOWS  

TEXAS INTERNATIONAL 

TRADE FAIR  

COLOSSAL FREE
Presented by Dr Pepper

nncRp7s 

"PARADE Of The 
STARS AND STRIPES" 

Nightly 

Southwestern Historical 

WAX MUSEUM  
AMERICAN INDIAN VILLAGE 

"FACES OF FREEDOM 
7! 

********************** 
1964 AUTOMOBILE SHOW 

MOBIL SKY REVUE 

"AGRICULTURE 
THE BIG PLUS"  

Sewing-Fashion Festival 
"INDIAN ART OF THE AMERICAS" 

GIANT SEATTLE WORLD'S 
FAIR FERRIS WHEEL 

TEXAS KITCHEN 
WINDOW 

AND LOTS, LOTS MORE! 
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L 0 	 T A Ate 
Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Nelson over 
the week end. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roland Offutt 
and daughter of Irving spent the 
Week end with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. T. Offutt. 

Mr. and Mrs. Worth Gafford 
visited their son and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Buddy Gafford and chil-
dren, in Wichita Falls last Sun-
day and Monday. 

.11E 
>' •'..! • 

Jerry Bowden of N. T. S. U. in 
Denton was a week end guest 
of his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Levi 
Bowden. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Searcey, 
Mrs. W. 0. Mays and Mrs. Lila 
Masters visited relatives in Abi-
lene last Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry' Johnson 
and children of Abilene spent the 
week end with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. C. Elliott. 

Too Late to Classify 
• 

SPECIAL 
New 4wheel trailer chassis, 

14-inch or 15-inch wheels. In 
bundle . . . . 

89.95 
Horton Equip. Co. 

FOR SALE -- Early Triumph 
wheat seed. J. T. Murdock, Go- 
ree, Texas. 	 134tp 

FOR RENT—Unfurnished 2 bed-
room rcok veneer house, 829 J. 
St. All built in fixtures with 
lots of closet space, venetian 
blinds. All in good repair, new-
ly painted inside and out, nice 
corner lot and lots of shade 
trees. Also gaarge. See owner 
next door east or call 0. V. 
Milstead, phone 4901. 	13-tfc 

firm packed in cartons labeled 
"A Good Egg Company" and 
sued the Texas Department of 
Agriculture in an attempt to re-
tain the name, declaring the Tex-
as Egg Law as unconstitutional. 

U.S.D.A. and Texas inspectors 
pointed out that the- company 
name was misleading and print-
ed in such a way that an "A 
Quality" egg was implied even 
though all grades were packed. 
The actual egg quality was print-
ed in much smaller type in an in-
conspicuous spot. The court not 
only ruled the egg law as consti-
tutional but also censured the 
owner for an obvious attempt to 
circumvent the law. 

Some' of the purposes of the 
Texas Egg Law are to encourage 
the production and maintenance 
of a good quality eggs; to keep 
inedible eggs off the market and 
to make certain all eggs are la-
beled properly as to grade and 
size. 

As a result, the Texas egg is a 
considerably better product IlOW 
tha-n a few years ago, and cur-
rent prices make them a gbod 
buy for the housewife. The_ law 
requires that all eggs be labeled 
according to their quality so that 
the buyer can make an informed 
selection. Some violations still 
occur from time to time but the 
Texas egg, today, ranks high on 
the national average. 

Three Local Students 
In Cisco College 

disco — Three students from 
Munday, Mable Claire Harpham, 
Patti Patterson and Dolan Ta-
ber, have completed registration 
requirements and will attend 
Cisco Junior College this fall, 
according to E. W. Mince, regis-
trar. 

Miss Harpham, a freshman, is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. C. Harpham. Miss Patterson, 
daughter of Mrs. Vera Patterson, 
is classified as a sophomore. 
Taber, a freshman, is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Artie R. Taber, also 
of Munday. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. H. Nelson vis-
ited his sister, Mrs. Lee Burni-
son, at the Bethania Hospital in 
Wichita Falls last Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. V. W. Caldwell 
and daughter, Mrs. Bill Hopper 
and son, all of Spearman, visited 

their vacation this week with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ches-
ter Lain and Mr. and Mrs. Oscar 
Spann. 

1111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111 

Farm Needs 
Regardless of the season of the year, 

we try to have a supply of farm needs for 
this partciular area. Here are some for 
the present season: 

Farm trailers 
Chasis, with or without tires, or the 

complete trailer. 

Stalk shredders 
Either new or used. 

A.C. Cotton Strippers 
Harvest the economical way. 

Reid'sHardware 
Phone 3461 
	

Mun day, Texas 

MRS BAIRIn 

PutA•Part 
BREAD 

P.S. Serve it Hot! 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Whittemore 
and Kenneth visited Mrs., Lee 
Burnison, who is a patient in the 
Bethania Hospital, and Mr. Burn-
ison, in Wichita Falls last Sun-
day. 

1111111111111111U111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111Umifillion  

of Casper, Wyo., left last Wed-
nesday after a week's vacation 
visit with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Press Phillips, and other 
relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Phillips, 
Suzann and Johnny, visited their 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Scott, Valarie and Vic-
tor, in Electra last Saturday. 
Valarie returned home with them 
for a week's visit. Mr. and Mrs. Marion Phillips 

FOR YOUR 

OFFICE NEEDS 
Bond Papers- 

Medium Grades 
Part Rag Content 
100% Rag Content 

Typewriter and Legal Size 
(light, medium and heavy 
weights). 

Onion Skins . . Second Sheets 	Carbons 

OTHER ITEMS 
Memeograph Paper 
	

Index Cards 
Ledger Sheets 
	

Index Card Files 
Ledger Binders (Post) 
	

Letter Files 

Ledger Index Guides 
	

File Holders 
Columnar Pads 
	

Staplers 

Fountain Pens 
	

Staples 
Columnar Sheets 
	

Index Tabs 
Duplicate Statements 
	

Mailing Labels 
Mimeograph Stencils 
	

Filing Cabinets 
Mimeograph Ink 
	

Da ters 
Hektograph Ink 
	

Manuscript Covers 
Typewriter Ribbons 
	

Sales Books 
Correction Fluid 
	

Lindy Pens 
Gum Tape 
	

Adding Machine Paper 

If we don't have it in stock we can get your office needs if 
avail able. 

The Munday Times 

$ Check These Specials $ 

Phone 5471, Munday 

• Job Estimating 	0 

• Choice Building Sites • 

Prices Are Always Right At 

WM. CAMERON & CO. 
BUILDING MATERIALS AND SERVICES 

Turn Key Contracting 

Complete Job Financing 

• 

658-6411, Knox City 



1(UNER'S 

APPLESAUCE 
303NO. 

	
CANS 

2 for 35c 

HUNT'S 

APRICOTS 
NO. 

 , 

3 for F
ANS 

MAXWELL HOUSE 

INSTANT 

Coffee 
tezic 

3 POUND CAN 

49t 

DEL MONTE SLICED PICKLED 16-Oz. JAR 

23c BEETS 

DEL 3IONTE NO. 303 CAN 

43: ASPARAGUS 

5 POUND RAG 

39t 

FRESH PORK 

ROAST 	Pound 39c 
ARMOUR'S STAR 

Bacon Pound 49c 
2-Pounds 98c 

Pound Pkg. 45c  

Pound 39c 

ARMOUR'S STAR 

FRANKS 
ARMOUR'S STAR 

BOLOGNA 

FRESH FRUITS and VEGETABLES 

D
OUS 

APPLES   	Pound 15c 

BANANAS 	Pound 9c 
K. V. FRESH 

BEANS Pound 19c 

Two Way Saving 
DOUBLE STAMPS AND SPECIALS ON TUESDAY 

• LOW EVERY DAY PRICES 

Morton & Welborn 

THE MUNDAY TIMES, THURSDAY, OCTOBER 3, 1963 

them to leave, 
Rats will travel further for 

food or water than mice. So there 
should be more bait stations 
where large numbers of mice are 
present. 

Officers Named For 
Benjamin 4-H Club 

The Benjamin 4-I-I club held 
their first meeting for the coin-
ing year Monday night, Septem-
ber 23 with good attendance. 
Plans w e r e discussed for the 
coming year with great enthusi-
asm. 

The following officers were 
elected: president, Judy Rober-
son, vice president, Pam Roberts; 
secretary, 'Sue Duke; treasurer, 
Charles Dodd; reporter, Dennis 
Kinnibrugh; c o u n c i I delegate, 
Charles Murray; parlimentarian, 
Janice Daniels; recreational lead-
er, George Doby; adult leader, 
Mrs. Loran Patterson; assistant 
leaders, Mrs. Bobby Roberson 
and Charles Griffith. 

GLADIOLA 

FLOUR LIBBY'S 

Fields of wheat and oats are 
beccming green •in places in the 
county and the season for the 
fall armyworm is on us. If you 
notice whitish patches appearing 
in grass or small grains, it is a 
good sign this pest has begun 
work. The favorite food of the 
armyworm is grasses such as 
crab grass, common and coastal 
Bermuda and Johnson grass. At 
first, the young larvae do not 
consume the entire leaf but skel-
tonize it, leaving the veings and 

The residue from a crop of ribs exposed. This causes the 

milo is vauable in the mainten- whitish patches to appear. 
ance of soil productivity and' Each female lays about 1000 
should be considered as an asset eggs in masse?; of about 150 each. 
ittAead of a liability. 	 , Eggs hatch in 2 to 4 days. Larvae 

The approximate 6000 lbs. of feed for 2 to 3 weeks. A genera-

residue from a 5000 lb. milo crop tion maye be completed in less  
contains about 85 lbs. oft total than a month. 	 •• 
notrogen, 25 lbs. phosphorus The full growth larvae are  

about 1 ui! inches in length. They 133205), and 125 lbs. of potassium 
0120). With good management may be identified by Ow presence 

!if a pinmine:it white inverted these nutrients can contribute  
-Y u on the front of the head. substantially to the requirements 

of the next crop. 	 I For control of fall armyworms 
Perhaps of greater importance on pasture grasses, Parathion, 

is the effect of the residue on Me t hyl Parathion, Toxaphene 
and Sevin may be used. Sevin has the maintenance or improvement 

of the physical structure of the not been approved for use on 
soil as reflected in better water `•m2-11  grain. However, Parathion, 
intake and retention, and better Methyl Parathion, DDT, Toxa- 
talth. 	 phene-DDT, and Endrin may be 

Many farmers follow the desir; used with the prover recdrictions. 

able practice of shredding stalks For more information refer to 
immediately a fter harvest and 	(1963) Texas Guide for 
the question of whether or not Controlling Insects on Grain, and 

to apply nitrogen to speed up the I' m-age eltPs• 
decomposition often arises. It is 	 * 
evident that for maximum protec- Now t hat cooler weather is 
ton against erosion much of the moving in, we can expect the 
residue should renttin on tile rats and mice to do the same. 
surface. Surface applied nitrogen They can be like those unwanted 
en exposed residue cannot be ex• ' kinfolks, who come to visit and 
petted to greatly speed up the like it so well they just stay. Rats 

PINEAPPLE 

LOCALS 
VAN CAMP 8-0Z. CANS 

2 for 39c 
QUART JAR 

39c 

 

BEANE-WEENEES  

u iracle Whip M 

 

    

* * 

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Whiteley 
and Mrs. Mae Stewart visited the 
ladies' parents, Mr. and Mrs. D. 
R. Marsh, in Fort Worth over the 
week end. Mrs. Stewart remainel 
to help care for her father, who 
is ill in the hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ivy Cypert are 
vacationing at interesting points 
in California for several weeks. 

MAXWELL HOUSE 

Coffee 
POUND CAN 

49c 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold E. Funk 
and family of Hemet, Calif., vis-
ited in Houston and Fallas and 
here with her mother, Mrs. A. M. 
Searcey, and R i c li a r d. Mrs. 
Searcey and Richard returned 
home with them for a month's 
visit. They returned home last 
Sunday. 

decaying process and a portion of 
the nitrogen can be lost to the 
atmosphere if left on the surface. 
Nitrogen applied to the residue 
should be worked into the soil at 
least partially if the organisms 
are to be active. 

Another factor to consider is 
that decomposition slows down 
as soil temperatures drop, and it 
proceeds fastest when soil tem-
perature is id ea 1 for plant 
LkillIV 	h. 

If the residue is likely to be a 
problem in next years cropping 
operation, nitrogen applied ahead 
of land cultivation can speed up 
residue breakdown. On the heav-
ier soils it may be practical to 
apply all of the nitrogen needed 
for next years crops provided the 
nitrogen is not left exposed on 
the surface. 

The practice of applying suf-
ficient fertilizer to take care of 
residue decomposition while the 
next crop is growing is quite 
satisfactory if you remember to 
use enough to take care of both 

ARMOUR'S VEGETOLE 

Shortening 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Steinbach and 

Mrs. Lena Eisenhauer of San An-
tonio visited relatives and friends 
here several days this week. 

STAR-KIST 

Tuna 
3 89c 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Jetton of 
Dallas were week end guests of 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs.. Edwin 
Jetton. 

and mice are filthy, disease car-
riers and very costly. They an-
nually ruin millions of dollars 
worth of food and property in 
the United States. With the ad-
vent of anti-coagulant baits, 
there is no excuse for putting up 
with them. 

The first step is to clean up old 
trash pile s, and storage bins. 
Destroy their breeding places. 
Then place anti-coagulant b a i t 
and water in their runways. 
Place a cover overthese stations 
such as a cardboard box with 
holes cut in to so the rodents 
can enter. This gives them a 
sense of security while they are 
feeding. Be sure the feeders and 
waterers do not become empty 
as the bait must be eaten over a 
period of several days time to be 
effective. Be sure the bait is 
fresh as it will be eaten more 
readily. 

Rats must have water every 
day but mice can live their entire 
lives without taking a drink. If 
a water trough is the only means 

the residue and crop require- of them getting water, then low- 
ment. 	 ering the water level will force 

GLADIOLA WHITE or YELLOW 

CORN MEAL 
Miss Helen Phillips visited 

friends in Abilene last week. 

CARD OF THANKS 
Sincere thanks to everyone for 

being so nice to me in my recent 
stay in the hospital. Especially 
those who stayed with me. For 
the prayers, visits, cards, flowers 
and spiritual boquets, may God 
bless each of you. 

Mrs. Anna Kuehler 	ltc 

AUSTEX SPAGETTI AND 	 NO. 303 CANS 	 GIANT BOX 

MEAT BALLS 	 2 for 49c Fab 	59c 

FINE QUALITY MEATS 

CRISCO 
3 POUND CAN 

i59c 
OUR DARLING CREAM 

CORN  

PUREX 

-SWIFT'S 

PREM 
12-0Z. CAN 

39c 

PARD 

DOG FOOD 
TALL CANS 
f 	 c 

NO. 211 CANS 

5 for 1.00 

NO. 303 CANS 

3 for 49c 
HALF GALLON 

39c 

LIBBY'S DEEP-BROWN 

BEANS 
14•OZ CANS 

2 for 2-9c 

5 POUND BAG 

39.c 

IOWANA 

OLEO Pound 10c  

2-lb. Loaf 69c 

Pound 29c 

VELVEETA 

CHEESE 
FRESH GRADE "A" 

FRYERS 

FRESH SPARE RIBS -- BARBECUE 
BEEF AND SAUSAGE — HOME MADE 
CHILI AND PIMIENTO CHEESE. 

FROZEN FOODS 
PATIO 

MEXICAN DINNERS 
Each 39c  

BORE N PEAS 	2 pkgs. 39c 
Uncle Sam still needs you 

Buy U. S. Savings Bonds to protect your 
country's future and provide for your own We Reserve The 

Right To Limit 
Quantities! 

This Advertisement Sponsored Jointly By: 

The First National Bank 	The Munday Times PHONE 3581 Free Delivery MUNDAY, TEXAS 
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