
Active Chamber of Commerce 
committees. for 1963.64 were 
named by the officers last week. 
They are as follows: 

Membership: D o r se Collins, 
chairman; Hugh Beaty, Charles 
Hogsett, Bobby Hutchinson, 
Ralph Cypert, W. E. Braly and 
J. C. Harpham. 

Budget: Gene Haynie, chair-
man; E. B. Littlefield, Dorse Col-
lins, Jesse Smith, Charles Baker, 
Gene Wood, James Smith, John 
E. Nelson and Barton Carl. 

Industrial: E. B. Littlefield, 
chairman; H. B. Stubblefiled, 
Ernest Horton, J. B. Scott, V. E. 
Moore and Raymond Carden. 

Activities: Charles Baker, 
chairman; Goodson Sellers, Paul 
Pendleton, Charles Sargent, Joe 
Morrow; Omar Cure, Jeff Ander-
son and Macon Johns. 

Publicity: Jesse Smith, chair-
man; Aaron Edgar. 

Water Resources: Gene Wood, 
chairman; L. B. Patterson, Ed-
ward Smith and C. P. Baker. 

Roads and Highways: James 
Smith, chairman; Jim Reeves, 
Tommie Harper, A. L. (Cotton) 
Smith, and H. H. Partridge. 

Agriculture: John E. Nelson, 
chariman; Tom Alvis, C. V. Wil-
liams, W. D. McMillan, H. H. 
Partridge,,W. R. Moore, Jr., Gene.  
Thompson and Lee Roy ILeflar. 

Retail Trades: Barton Carl, 
chairman; V. E. Moore, Robert 
Nix, W. 0. Smith, Albert Loran, 
Joe Choucair, Mary Cartwright 
and Sied Waheed. 

Vegetable Festival: Jesse 
Smith, chairman; Charles Mc-
Cauley, L. B. Patterson, H. H. 
Partridge, Kenneth Baker, Omar 
Cure, Chalmer Hobert and L. D. 
Offutt. 

Mogul Band Is .  

Winner Friday 

Deanery Meeting 
Held On April 25th 

The seceond quarterly meeting 
of the Wichita Falls Deanery 
was held on Thursday, April 25, 
at the Knights of Columbus Hall 
in Rhineland. Members of the St. 
Ann's Christian Mothers Society 
were hostesses for the occasion. 

Mrs. Lynn Holman, Seymour, 
introduced Father Patrick Scan-
lan, assistant pastor of Sacred 
Heart Parish, of Wichita Falls. 
He spoke on "The Clerical Rank 
in the Catholic Church." 

Mrs. Jim Kelly, Deanery presi-
dent, gave a resume of plans for 
the Diocesan Council of Catholic 
Women convention which will be 
held in October at Wichita Falls. 

Lions Club Plans 
For Ladies' Night 

Plans are being completed this 
week for the Munday Lions 
Club's annual ladies' night, 
which will be at 7:30 pan. Tues-
day, May 7, at the school lunch 
room. 

The banquet will be served by 
ladies of the lunch room, and an 
interesting program is being 
planned for this event. Among 
visiting Lions will be District 
Governor and Mrs. Pete Shotwell 
of Abilene. 	 • 

New officers of the Munday 
club, who will take office soon, 
will be introduced at this meet-
ing. 

Capt. and Mrs. Harold Honey-
cutt and son visited relatives 
here over the week end. They 
were enroute to their home in 
Abilene from three weeks in Illi-
nois where Capt. Honeycutt at-
tended a training school. 

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Johnson vis-
ited their daughter and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe W. Stevens and 
sons, in Clyde over the week end. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ivy Cypert and 
daughter, Charline White, of 
Fort Worth have just returned 
from two weeks visit with anoth-
er daughter, Mrs. Robert Grey-
beck, and family in Elk Horn 
City, Kentucky. Mr. Greybeck is 
superintendent of Republic Steel 
Coal Mine in Elk Horn City. 

Final Pack Meet 
Held On Friday 

The final meeting of Pack 76 
for the current year was held 
last Friday evening in the social 
hall of the Church of Christ. 

After a picnic supper was en-
joyed by the 60 cubs and parents 
present, an impressive ceremony 
was conducted honoring seven 
graduating cubs. Bill Beaty and 
David Key, dressed as Indians, 
danced around a table and led 
each of the graduating cubs to 
the ceremonial table. Each boy 
in turn received the light from. 
the central candle of club-scout-
ing, .then was awarded his Web-
lcos award along with his gradu-
ation certificate. Rev. Rex L. 
Mauldin, cubmaster, made the 
awards. 

Graduating w e r e: Kenneth 
Booe, Allen Beaty, Billy Carden, 
Wayne Gates, Tat Hobert, Brad 
Partridge and Floyd Reed. 

The den with the highest num-
ber of awards per member was 
Den 2: of which Mrs. Hugh Beaty 
and Mrs. Wayne Gate's are den 
mothers. A total of 55 awards 
were made. 

Local Women 
Attend Training 
For Girl Scouts 

Knox County 
Hospital Notes 

Patients dismissed f r o m the 
hospital since 4-21-63: 

Mrs. Ida , Loftis, Rochester; 
Mrs. Frank Howley, Munday; 
Louis and Corine Lozado, Goree; 
Timothy Wheat, Knox City; Dale 
Bloxham Hawkins, Knox City; 
Litt Lemley, Munday; Mrs. Anna 
Wilde, Munday; Mrs. Felton 
Jackson, Goree; Mrs. Lois 
Spikes, Knox City; Roy Day, 
Knox City; Mrs. W. G. Johnson, 
O'Brien; A. V. Kemletz, Knox 
City; Mrs. Eddie L. Johnson, 
Bangs; Sammie B. White, Knox 
City; Mrs. Joe Rojas, O'Brien; 
Mrs. Tommy Beach, Munday; 
Mrs. Ezequel G a r c e s, O'Brien; 
Dusty Bateman, Knox City; Jean 
Pierre Cammack, Knox City; 
Mrs. Mary Dixon, Gore e; Ted 
Clary, Knox City; D. R. Stephens, 
Munday; Mrs. Ross Oliver, Knox 
City; Merle Lambeth, Goree; 
Mrs. Truman Keiffer, O'Brien; J. 
O. Corely, Knox City. 

Patients in the hospital 4.28-63: 
Miss Maude Isbell, Munday; 

Charles Moorhouse, Munday; R. 
F. Richards, Vera; Mrs. C. L. 
Burt, Knox City; Maud Lemons, 
Munday; W. E. McQueen, 
O'Brien; Jimmie Booe, Knox 
City; Doss Jernigan, Vera; Mrs. 
J. A. Hill, Munday; Mrs. Ralph 
Hall, Knox City; Mrs. Billy Heck, 
Seymour; Mrs. Chris Jemenez, 
O'Brien; Mrs. D. E. Griffin, 
O'Brien; R. S. Shelton, Knox 
City; Mrs. Mickey Jackson, Mun-
day; W. F. Snod y, Benjamin; 
Earl Woodward, Knox City; La-
verne Rodgers, 'Rochester; Inez 
Carver, Knox City; Rose Marie 
Keith, Benjamin; Mrs. J. B. Tib-
bets, Rochester. 

Births: Mr. and Mrs. Joe Rojas, 
O'Brien, a boy; Mr. and Mrs. Tom-
my Beach, Munday, a boy; Mr. 
and Mrs. Ezequel Garces, O'Brien, 
a boy; Mn and Mrs. Dixon, Go-
ree, a boy; Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Beck, Seymour, a boy; Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Hall, Knox City, a 
boy. 

Deaths: Mike Turner. 
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Area Firemen To 
Meet On Sunday 

Munday High School Chorus T o Re Featured In Program C-C Committees 
For Year Listed 

Between 300 and 400 firemen-
and their wives are expected to 
converge on Monday during the 
week end for the semi-annual 
meeting of the West Texas Fire-
men's and Fire Marshal's Associ-
ation. The. meeting is being host-
ed by the Munday Volunteer Fire 
Department for the first time in 
several years. - 

Although a few visiting fire-
men may arrive Saturday, activi-
ties of the meeting will not get 
under way until Sunday. 

Registration will be held from 
11 a.m. to 1 p.m. at the fire hall, 
and the program will be held at 
the .Munday elementary school 
gymnasium. 

Pre-program entertainment will 

be given directly after noon by. 
the Munday High School stage 
band under the direction of 
Bobby Brooks, Mogul Band di-
rector. 

The program will get under 
way at 1 p.n1. with the invoca-
tion by Howard Emerson, chap-
lain of the local fire department. 
Further entertainment will be 
given by the stage band, Gary 
Bruce, the high school quartet 
and sextet. 

Mayor V. E. Moore will give 
the welcome, and response will 
be made by Ben Adams of Archer 
City, district president. 

Principal address for the meet-
ing will be given by Don Timber-
lake, civil defense director of 
Abilene. 

The remainder of the after-
noon will be devoted to races, 
contests and water polo, and the 
day will be climaxed with the 
evening meal at the school cafe-
teria, served by Underwood's 
Catering Service. 

Kracker KrumbS 
Odd Bits Salvaged 

By The Editor 

"G o o d morning. Everything's 
looking pretty good here in the 
great southwest!" 

k—k 
Earl Sargent in his radio farm 

report, "Sarge Reports," starts 
his broadcast off in that manner 
almost every morning. We'd like 
to repeat his statement, particu-
larly for Knox County. She's 
a-lookin' pretty good! 

k—k 
Especially since the showers of 

the week end. These came in 
about Three relays—Friday, Sat-
urday and early Sunday morn- 

- ing—bringing a total of .88 of 
an inch here in Munday, which 
isn't a big lot but enough to help 
a lot right at this stage of the 

• game. 
k—k 

Coming as it did, the rain will 
cause very little replanting in 
the immediate Munday area. We 
cant say to much for an area 
from Weinert to Haskell, how-
ever, where the rainfall ranged 
to three inches and upwards and 
flooded low places in the fields. 

k—k 
The moisture has boosted' the 

wheat crop, we think. We heard 
that a local citizen said last week 
that since the wheat is headed 
and on its way toward filling 
out, a rain wouldn't particularly 
help it. "Just the same," we says, 
"if we had a wheat crop a rain 
would be plumb welcome." 

Better to come now than a few 
weeks later, when harvest time 
is nearing. This is a time that we 
nearly always have rain. 

k—k. 
Wheat fields are very beautiful 

right at this period, and the sight 
is made more attractive to the 
eye when the wind blows, send-
ing great waves through the 
fields of headed grain. 

Munday High School's 
voice chorus, a portion of which 
is pictured above, will present 
"This Is America" • on Friday 
night, May. 3, at 8 o'clock in the 
grade school auditorium, under 
the direction of Rev. Rex L. 
Mauldin. 

taurant, and many others. 
Accompanists for the program 

will . be Jan Hawkins, Eddie 
Littlefield and Linda Brown. 
Soloists will include Jackie Mor-
row, Karen Johnson, Kenneth 
Smith, Paul Reed, Phyllis Yost 
and Millie Moore. Various en-
semble nuMbers are included, 
such as quartets, sextets, duets, 
etc. 

Price of admission is 75 cents 
for adults and 50 cents for stu-
dents. Pre-school children will be 
admitted free of charge when ac-
companied by their parents. 

The plot for the musical is tak-
ing from important events in 
American History. Settings have 
been designed by various parents 
of the youth in the chorus. 

The program will be divided 
into two parts with an intermis- 

100- sion of 10 minutes separating 
them. The first potion will in-
clude a scene of tije Statute of 
Liberty and anotheri of the Min-
utemen of the Rdvoluntionary 
War; also the old dhisolm Trail 
and a typical "Quilting Bee." The 
first portion will dose with a 
scene from the oia South and 
the stirring "Battle Hymn of the 
Republic," which will be done in 
seven parts with two pianists. 

The second portion will depict 
scenes representing typical "Hill-
billy Life," the "Roaring Twen-
ties;" a modern sophisticated res- 

Terry Harrison 
Dies On Monday 

Terry Harrison, 57, former resi-
dent of Munday, passed away 
last Monday in the Stephenville 
hospital. He had been in failing 
health for several months. 

Mr. Harrison resided in Mun-
day for many years before mov-
ing to Stephenville some two or 
three years ago. He was a carpen-
ter by trade and also operated a 
furniture repair and upholstery 
shop here for a time. Mrs. Har-
rison established the children's 
dress s h o p, Bertha's Babyland, 
here and operated it until the 
family decided to 'move to Ste-
phenville. 

Mr. Harrison, a member of the 
Church of Chrit, was also active 
in the Masonic Lodge here for 
a time, and served one term as 
master :of Knox Lodge No. 851, 
AF&AM at Munday. 

Surviving are his wife, Mrs. 
Bertha Harrison of Stephenville; 
two daughters, Mi.s. Maxine Voss 
of Stephenville and Mrs. Peggy 
Hoff of Westover, • Mass., and 
three sons, Maj. Stephen Harri-
son of 'Sumter, S. C., Kenneth and 
Donald Harrison of Houston; his 
mother, Mrs. Nora Harrison of 
Arlington. 

Funeral services were held at 
2 p.m. Tuesday from the North 
Side Church of Christ in Stephen-
ville, with burial in Stephenville 
Cemetery. 

Joseph C. Herren, 
Goree, Succumbs 

Arthur T. Howard 
Dies At Goree; 
Funeral Tuesday 

Arthur T. Howard, 59, well 
known Goree resident, passed 
away at 6 a.m. Monday at his 
Goree home following a heart 
attack. He had been in ill health 
for several years. 

Mr. Howard, a retired farmer, 
was born August 23, 1903, in 
Alvord, Texas, and had lived in 
Goree since 1920. He was married 
December 30, 1933, to Lois Jones 
in Seymour. 

He was a member of the First 
Baptist Church of Goree. 

Funeral services were held at 
2 p.m. Tuesday from the First 
Baptist Church in Goree with the 
pastor, Rev. Benny Hagen, of-
ficiating. He was assisted by Rev. 
A. N. Motes, pastor of the Goree 
Methodist Church. 

Burial was in Goree Cemetery 
under the direction of McCauley 
Funeral Home. -Serving as pall-
bearers were Lee Patterson, John 
Lloyd Lambeth, Everett Barger, 
Arnold Land, Bill Farmer and 
Felton Lambeth. 

Survivors include his wife, Mrs. 
Lois Jones Howard; a brother, 
J. M. Howard of Wichita Falls; 
and two nephews, Beaty Howard 
of Lubbock and Wayne Howard 
of San Angelo. 

Knox City Rites 
For Turner Child 
Held On Thursday 

Funeral services were held at 
3 p.m. Thursday from the Ro-
chester Church of Christ for 
James Michael Turner, 12, who 
passed away at the Knox County 
Hospital at 10 a.m. Wednesday, 
April 24. Jerome Savage, former 
minister, officiated, !and burial 
was in Knox City Cemetery. 

A victim of Cystic fibrosis, he 
had spent much of his life in 
hospitals. He was admitted to the 
hospital on April 13. 

Born in Knox City on April 25, 
1950, .he had lived in Knox Coun-
ty all his life except for three 
years in Littlefield. 

Survivors are his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. R. Turner of Knox 
City; one 'brother, Don of the 
home; his maternal grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Burleson 
of Rochester; and his paternal 
grandmother, Mrs. J. M. Turner 
of Fort Worth. 

k—k 
Someone remarked the other 

day. that we were right in the 
garden spot of the area—but you 
don't have to go very far in any 
direction, he concluded, until you 
find it not so good. Kinda bears 
out what we've been saying 
about conditions to the north and 
northwest, where we've traveled 
recently. 

k—k 
The 'tater crop seems to be 

coming along nicely, too, and the 
showers of the week end didn't 
do this crop no harm, either. Of 
course, we realize that with irri-
gation, potatoes can he give n 
water most any time they need 
it, but farmers welcome an op-
portunity to shut off those wells 
for a spell. 

k—k 
A number of other vegetables 

are being grown locally this year, 
and these will contribute greatly 
to the success of the area's first 
vegetable festival, which will be 
staged here on June 22.• 

k—k 
It's interesting, too; that quite 

a few more cantaloupes are being 
grown this year. Most of the 
growers, we believe, have an es-
tablished market for t hem at 
planting time. They learned the 
hard way a few years back that 
you can't piddle around with 
these melons. They're ready to-
day, and too ripe tomorrow! 

k—k 
We learned this week that our 

former postmaster, Lee Haynes, 
has given up farming. For sev-
eral years, he has farmed that 
lot just to the east of his home, 
planting it in cotton, and for 
which he had a cotton allotment. 
He stated that he turned all of 
his allotment back to the govern-
ment this year, and has quit. The 
reason: The lot has been sold, 
and the Jeff Anderson's are 
building a home on it. 

k—k 
B. 0. Norvill told us, too, that 

he planted his corn• patches in 
wheat this year. He said he al-
most made a complete failure 
last year •and allowed as how he'd 
put too much Munday water into 
the soil. 

Joseph C. Herren, 68, resident 
of Goree for some 14 years, pass-
ed away at 1:30 a.m. Monday 
in the Veterans Hospital in Big 
Spring. 

Mr. Herren, a retired farmer, 
was born February 5, 1895, in 
Venita, Texas, and had lived near 
Goree since November •2, 1949. 
He served in the U. S. Army dur-
ing World War I, and was mar-
ried to Nora Hayes on January 
27, 1922. 

Funeral services were held at 
2 p.m. Wednesday from the First 
Baptist Church in Goree with the 
pastor, Rev. Benny Hagan, of-
ficiating. He was assisted by Rev. 
A. N. Motes, pastor of .the First 
Methodist Church in Goree. 

Burial was in Goree Cemetery 
under the direction of McCauley 
Funeral Home. 

Survivors include his wife of 
Goree; two daughters, Mrs. Est-
her Stockard of Waco and Mrs. 
Ethel Holmna of Chicago, Ill.; 
five grandchildren and three 
great-grandchildren. 

Dunbar Students 
Are State Winners 

Otha Wayne Boozer of Dunbar 
High School in Munday was first 
place winner in senior declama-
tion at the state meet held at 
Prairie View A&M College last 
week end. 

He is the son of Principal and 
Mrs. Hampton Boozer and is a 
junior student. He holds three 
state speaking awards. 

Peggy Boozer received an ex-
cellent rating in piano solo, and 
a mixed octet received a rating of 
good in Division III. 

Weather Report 
For seven days ending 7 p.m. 

April 30, 1963, as compiled by H. 
P. Hill, U. S. Weather Observer. 

LOW HIGH 
1963-1962 1963-1962 

April 24 — 56 	58 	85 	71 
April 25 — 60 	54 	82 	82 
April 26 — 60 	56 	80 	88 
April 27 — 63 	57 	79 	79 
April 28 — 62 	51 	81 	87 
April 29 -- 57 	60 	81 	97 
April 30 — 53 	58 	78 	91 
Precipitation 1963 	' 4.57 in. 
Precipitation 1962 	 2.99 in. 
Precipitation this week __ .88 in. 
Normal to this date 	5.80 

Officers Named 
For Local P. T. A. 

k—k 
And it would appear that it's 

left up to Wally Park to prove 
(or disprose) that peas won't 
make when planted in the dark 
of the moon. We stated a few 
weeks ago that we were in with 
him on this project, but our 
planting failed to come up to a 
stand. Seems that we're another 
"city farmer" who needs to quit 
the business! 

	

	 • 
k—k 

It was interesting to look over 
a copy of The Dallas Morning 
News dated November 12, 1918, 
which C. L. Mayes found at his 
home and brought us. It announc-
ed the end of World War I with 
a subheading: "Everything For 
Which The United States Fought 
Has Been Accomplished." Inter-
esting, we say, almost 45 years 
later! 

The Munday P. T. A. elected 
officers for the coming year at 
their regular meeting last week. 
Officers elected are as follows: 

President, David Bardin; first 
vice president, Mrs. G. E. Rog-
ers; second vice president, Mrs. 
Andy Hutchinson; secretary, 
Mrs. Edward Smith; treasurer, 
Mrs. Doris Dickerson; parliamen-
tarian, Tom Alvis; historian, Mrs. 
Lonnie Offutt. 

These officers will be installed 
at the May meeting. 

Methodist Men To 
Enjoy Fish Fry 

The annual fish fry of the 
Methodist Men's Club of Munday 
will be held on Monday night, 
May 6, at the C. P. Baker cabin 
on Lake Kemp. 
- Speaker for this event will be 
Rev. Kenneth Wyatt, pastor of 
the First Methodist Church of 
Chillicothe. 

Worth Gafford and Kenneth 
Baker have been catching fish 
for the past several weeks, and it 
is reported that they already have 
85 pounds on hand. 

New officers for 1963.64 will be 
elected at this meeting. Retiring 
officers are Joe Morrow, presi-
dent; Kenneth Baker, vice presi-
dent, and Wayne Josselet, secre-
tary and treasurer. 

Eighteen Munday women took 
advantage of the Girl Scout 
Leadership Training sessions in 
Wichita Falls last month.. In four 
days the course covered every as-
pect of Girl Scouting. The new 
program that all Girl' Scouts will 
change to next September was 
explained in detail. 

Mrs. Marie Heritake, a volun-
teer trainer, and Mrs. Ruth 
Smethie, NorCenTex field advis-
er, gave the training course. New 
leaders and women interested in 
scouting from the eleven county 
council area took the training at 
Sheppard Air Force Base. They 
returned home with new pro-
gram ideas, games, songs, and a 
clearer understanding of the 
principles and purposes of Girl 
Scouting. 

An investure ceremony climax-
ed the-  four-days of training. The 
group repeated the Girl Scout 
pledge and gave the ten laws. 
Mrs. Heritage pinned the Girl 
Scout pin on each trainee and 
welcomed them into scouting. 

Leadership training sessions 
are offered-by the council twice • 
a year, in the spring and fall. 
This enables women new to 
scouting to be fully trained be-
fore they undertake the respon-
sibility of a troop of girls. Mun-
day women benefitting from this 
past session were „Mmes. Jean 
Allen, Mary Cartwright, Hazel 
Cypert, Carol Eiland, Ned Eiland, 
Leora Guess, Sue Haynie, Jo Hill, 
Edith Hobert, Pansey Josselet, 
Winters Matthews, Nedra Mc-
Cauley, Wynette Moore, Reba 
Nix, Betty Patterson, Jean 
Smit h, Catherine Stodghill and 
Mildred . Vadney. 

On April 18 the Munday wo-
men attended a tea at the council 
office on the Seymour Highway 
in honor of Miss Alice Mulkey. 
She is the council adviser for 
the National Field Staff of the 
Girl Scouts of America for region 
9. Miss Mulkey serves the Nor-
CenTex council as liaison be-
tween the local council and re-
gional director. 

A County-wide meeting will be 
held Thursday, May 9, 8:00 p.m. 
at Rhineland High School, to ex-
plain, the upcoming wheat refer-
endum. Everyone is coordially in-
vited to attend. Tom Hunter, area 
farm management specialist, Jes-
se Gilpin, A. S. C. S. office man-
ager. and I will be on the pro-
gram. 

For the second time in the past 
two years, and for the second 
time in the history of the Mun-
day Schools, the Mogul Band 
won regional Interscholastic 
League sweepstakes on Friday, 
April 26th, in Wichita Falls. 
Band boosters, band parents, and 
the students came home happy 
over the showing the band made. 

Entering against all the Class 
A bands in the region, the band 
came home as sweepstakes win-
ners after placing first in region-
al marching in the fall and then 
winning first in concert and 
sight-reading last Friday. There 
were forty-one bands competing 
over a two day period for top 
ratings. 

A band must win first in all 
competitions to be adjudged a 
"Sweepstakees" band. Judges for 
the event were Everette Maxwell, 
band director of Abernathy; Fred 
Stockdale, band director of Pam-
pa; Oakley Pitman, band director 
of S. M. U.; and Ray Robbins, 
band director of Phillips. 

After the contest the band Was 
treated with a meal of barbecue 
by the Band Boosters at Under- 
woods in Wichita Falls. The 
Band Boosters will meet Monday 
night, May 6th, to decide about 
the end of the school trip for 
the band. All band boosters are 
urged to attend. 
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Munday Study Club 
Meets On April 25 Roxy Theatre 

PHONE 7451 
The Munday Study Club met 

Thursday, April 25, in. the club 
house for the last meeting of 
the year. 

Mrs. M. H. Reeves was director 
of the program which was given 
by Mrs. C. P. Baker, who brought 
poems by Robert Frost, 1875-
1863. 

The business meeting was con-
ducted by the president, Mrs. C. 
P. Baker. The civic and club-
house chairmen reported that the 
club lot had been sold and that 
repairs on the clubhouse would 
begin at once. 

The scholarship chairman re-
ported that a girl had been select-
ed to receive the $100 scholarship 
to be used in a school of nursing. 
The club accepted this selection. 

Officers for another year were 
installed by Mrs. J. C. Borden. 
Some changes in the club by-laws 
were voted. 

The new officers will be pre-
sented at the opening the club 
year in September. 

the home of Mr. and Mrs. Merick 
McGaughey and Skeet Sunday. 
Rev. Cole preached for Rev. 
Queen who is ill in the hospital. 

Mrs. G le n n Dunkle of Dallas 
is visiting in the home of her 
mother, Mrs. Lil Moorhouse, 
other relatives and friends. 

Mrs. Sam Leaverton is in 
California visiting in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Nicky Leaverton 
and son. 

Mr. and Mrs. Edward Barnett 
and son, Gregg, of Ft. Worth vis-
ited in the home of Mrs. Bonnie 
Terry and Vicki and Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete Barnett, other relatives here 
Sunday. 

of Hale Center visited Sunday Mr. and Mrs. Merick Mc-
with Mr. and Mrs. Leroy Brooks. Gaughey were in Paducah Friday 

Mrs. Betty Richburg of Gor- afternoon to attend the opening 
man visited last week with her of the horse show and rodeo. 
brother and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. C. Watson. Mr. and Mrs. Ron-
nie Richburg of Gorman visited 
Sunday with the Watsons. Mrs. 
Richburg returned home with 
her son and wife. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Hertel and 
sons of Seymour visited Mr. and 
Mrs. E. B. Hosea and Brad Sat-
urday. 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 

In first zone, per year 	 2.55 

In second zone, per year 	__3.57 
Friday-Saturday-Sunday 

May 34-5 

Watch For All Of Our 
Big New Pictures! 

• 

The Munday Times Is Democratic, yet supporting only what It 
believes to be right, and opposing what it believes to be wrung, 
regardless of party policies, publishing news fairly, impartlallY. 

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC: Any erroneous reflection upon the 
character, standing, or reputation of any person, firm or cor-
poration which may appear In the columns of this paper, will 
be gladly corected upon due notice being given to the publisher, 
at the Munday Times office. 

Munday H. ,D. Club 
In Recent Meeting Goree News 

Miss Shirley Booe 
Honored At Shower 

The Munday Home Demonstra-
tion Club met in the home of Mrs. 
Tolbie Winchester for an inter-
esting program as Mrs. R. M. 
Almanrode reviewed the book 
"The Recovery of Family Life." 

Roll call was answered with 
"My Sewing Problems" by six 
members and one visitor. Plans 
were made to attend District Day 
May 7 in Vernon. 

Rally day was discussed for 
Haskell-Baylor and Knox Coun-
ties to be held in Gilliland. Games 
of Password was directed by Mrs. 
Gill Wyatt. 

The next meeting will be in the 
home of Mrs. Joe Patterson for 
a Mother's day program. 

BENJAMIN NEWS 

urday night. The Lankford's ac-
companied the Smith's to Abi-
lene Sunday to visit another sis-
ter, Mr. and Mrs. George Davis 
std children, Carol and George 
Allan. 

Mrs. John Broach went to 
Lubbock Tuesday to be with her 
mother when she underwent sur-
gery in the Lubbock hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Steward 
took their daughter, Pat, to Waco 
Friday where she enrolled in the 
Baylor University. Pat will be 
working on her masters degree. 

David Bates is visiting rela-
tives in Wichita Falls this week. 

Miss Ann Waldon of Littlefield, 
fiance of singer, Bill Upchurch, 
was a Goree visitor Sunday. 

Mr. Silas Cochran of Nocona 
visited his sister and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. George Stambaugh, 
Thursday night. 

Mrs. G. W. Redwine of Dumas 
visited her daughter and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Hutchens 
and Allan, last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Joe Cun-
ningham and family of Electra 
visited Mr. and Mrs. G. 0. Den-
ham Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Donoho 
and Kathy visited Saturday night 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
D. It. Donoho. 

Mrs. R. M. Bishop of Ranger is 
visiting her daughter and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Pelfrey 
this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Pierce Tomlinson 

Gilliland Club 
Meets On Wednesday 

Mrs. Clyde . Patton returned 
borne Thursday from several 
days visit with relatives in Wich-
ita Falls and Burkburnett. 

. Visiting Mrs. Bill Orsak last 
gaturday were Mrs. Frank Stein-
bach and daughter of Rhineland, 
Mrs. F. C. Roy, Chico, Calif.; 
Mrs. Joe Birkenfeld and children, 
Mrs. Leroy Brooks and Mrs. Wal-
ter Mooney. Visiting in the home 
Stinday were Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Urban of Haskell and Mr. and 
Mrs. Otto Patcek of Bomarton. 

Mr. and Mrs. Barton Carl and 
daughters visited in Fort Worth 
Sunday. 

'Mr. and Mrs. John Smith and 
Joyce of Wichita Falls visited 
Mrs. Smith's sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. D. Lankford and family Sat- 

Wednesday and Thursday 
May 8-9 

CARLOAD NITE — 51.00 

A bridal shower honoring Miss 
Shirley Booe, bride elect of Gor-
don Smith of Goree, was held in 
the home of Mrs. .1. A. Hill, Jr., 
Saturday afternoon, April 27. 

Mrs. Hill greeted the guests 
and presented them to the hono-
ree, her mother, Mrs. Ervin 
Booe, Mrs. Douglas Smith, •moth-
er of the groom to be. 

The serving table was covered 
with a white cloth centered with 
a miniature bride and groom in 
a background of greenery. On 
either side were small lighted 
flower candles and leading from 
this were blue streamers bearing 
the names Shirley and Gordon. 

Alternating at the register and 
serving table during the after-
noon were Misses Carol Ann 
Phillips, Joan Cude, Vicki Heis-
kell, Phillis Yost, Jan Hawkins, 
Pat Hill and Sue Armstrong. 

Hostesses were Mmes. Hill, 
Grady Phillips, Les Phillips, El-
mer Bruce, A. C. Boggs, Clyde 
Hackney, J. R. Hill, Jr., Jim 
Welch, 0. C. Poe and John Pey-
sen of Munday and Mmes. Gerald 
Myers and Wesley Kinman of 
Goree. 

The couple will be married 
May 24 in the Church of Chtist 
in Munday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Buster Pape and 
daughters took Mrs. Henry Pape 
and daughter, who spent last 
week here and at Goree, to her 
home in Fort Worth last Satur-
day and remained over Sunday 
for a visit with their son. 

The Gilliland Home Demon-
stration Club me ton Wednesday 
of last week with the president, 
Mrs. A. L. Cook, calling the meet-
ing to order. 

The group repeated the THDA 
prayer and sang songs. Mrs. 
Homer Martin conducted a game 
and read a poem entitled "Lend 
a Helping Hand." June Navratil 
gave the council report. 

Mrs. W. A. Park gave an inter-
esting talk on "How to be 
Serene." Plans were made for a 
Mother's day celebration. Mrs. 0. 
R. Miller was appointed chairman 
of the program. Each club mem-
ber is to ask some non-club 
mother to attend. 

Mrs. E. G. Navratil served re-
freshments to eleven members. 

Jimmy Bell of Abilene was a 
business visitor here last week. 
He also visited his mother, Mrs. 
Jim Bell. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Lane of 
Lubbock visited his brother, Joe 
Lane, and family several days 
this week. 

Time Franklin 

Piano Technician 
Tuning Repairs 

Mnnday, Texas — Phone 7421 Ready -Mix 
Concrete 

Munday Vicinity, $13.00 per yd. 
Minimum 4 Yards 

New gravel pit opened. Extra good gravel. 

A. E. Bowley Sand and Gravel 
One Block East of Signal Light 

Mr. and Mrs. Jeff Mitchell vis-
ited Miss Becky Arrott and other 
relatives in Palo Pinto last Sun-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Bell and 
children of Gainesville visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Riley Bell, 
and family last Wednesday night 
and Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Chitty of 
Plainview visited his uncle, 0. V. 
Chitty, and Mrs. Chitty and Mr. 
and Mrs. D. V. Gilbert and girls 
one day last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Shorty Conner 
and daughters were in Arizona 
last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Davey Oxford of 
Grand Prairie spent the week 
end with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Ryder, and Judy recent-
ly. 

Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Benham 
and son, Von, and Mrs. Regie 
Kester of Chillicothe visited in 
the home of Mrs. Bonnie Terry 
and Vicki and other friends here 
last Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Jennings 
and Mrs. Claud Jennings spent 
the week end with relatives in 
Fort Worth. 

Recent visitors of Mr. and Mrs. 
Rufus Benson were Mrs. Wanda 
Joyce Jennings, Donna Sue, Car-
la and Sandy of Wichita Falls; 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Benson and 
David of Seymour and Mr. and 
Mrs. Vernon Benson and Gene 
Howse of Flagler, Colo. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Ervin 
and daughter of Lake Worth vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. Bill Hamilton 
over the week end. 

Mrs. Gary Johnson and son of 
Lovibg, N. M., returned home 
last week after spending several 
days with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Oscar Hudspeth. 

Mrs. Ola Mayfield left for 
Clyde last week where she will 
make her home. 

Mr. and Mrs. 0. V. Chitty and 
Mrs. D. V. Gilbert were visitors 
in Seymour recently. 

Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie Mc-
Gaughey and family of Abilene 
and Rev. John Cole and Mrs. 
Cole of Stamford were visitors in 

BIRTH ANNOUNCEMENT 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Gaines of 

Dallas are proudly announcing 
the arrival of a son on Wednes-
day, April 23, 1963. He weighed 
6 pounds and 10 ounces and has 
been named Gregg Gordon. He 
has a big sister; Suzanne, and a 
big brother, Gary who are very 
proud of him. Grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Gaines of Mun-
day and Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Hitch-
cock of Knox City. 

CARD OF THANKS 
I wish to thank .each one for 

the cards, visits and prayers dur-
ing my recent stay in the hos-
pital. May God bless each of you 
is my prayer. 

Mrs. G. M. Roden ltp 

IMIN11111111111111SISIS 
Evangelist Gilbert N. Calloway 

of the First Baptist Church in 
Wylie visited with his aunts, Mrs. 
Ben Tuggle and Mrs. Henry 
Waler, last Saturday. He was in 
a revival at the Mission Baptist 
Church in Seymour. Mrs. Walker, 
Mrs. Tuggle and Mrs. Evlyne 
Malmos attended services there 
on Saturday night. 

1963 

Little League Schedule 
Potted Plants: In these we have a 

beautiful array of Hydrengeas, Chrysan- 
themums, Foliage Plants, etc. 

We also haVe cut flowers and cor- 
sages. Place your order now! 

Conner Nursery & Floral Co. 
Haskell, • Texas 

Crop Hail Insurance 
Including fire—in time-tested companies for your pro-

tection. Come by and let us quote you rates and conditions. 

Wallace Moorhouse 
4th Block North of Ford Dealer 

Phone 4051 	 Munday, Texas 
June 10 Yanks-Red Sox 

Braves-Cards 
June 13 Cards-Yanks 

Red Sox-Braves 
June 17 Braves-Red Sox 

Yanks-Cards 
June 20 Cards-Red Sox 

Yanks-Braves 
June 24 Braves-Yanks 

Red Sox-Cards 
June 27 Cards-Braves 

Red Sox-Yanks 
July 1 Yanks-Red Sox 

Braves-Cards 
July 4 No Game 
July 8 Cards-Yanks 

Red Sox-Braves 
July 11 Braves-Red Sox 

Yanks-Cards 

fmmigasimES 

May 6 Yanks-Braves 
Cards-Red Sox 

May 9 Red Sox-Cards 
Braves-Yanks 

May 13 Cards-Braves 
Red Sox-Yanks 

May 16 No Game 
May 20 Yanks-Red Sox 

Braves-Cards 
May 23 Cards-Yanks 

Red Sox-Braves 
May 27 Braves-Red Sox 

Yanks-Cards 
May 30 Cards-Red Sox 

Yanks-Braves 
June 3 Braves-Yanks 

Red Sox-Cards 
June 6 Cards-Braves 

Red Sox-Yanks 

• 

1111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111  

You Can Bank On Our 

Many Services! 

Whether you come in to deposit your 
money, send it by mail, or use our night 
depository service, you can be sure that 
your money will be safe. 

Yes, banking here is safe and con- 
venient. We're ready to h e 1 p you with 
your banking problems, giving you every 
service consistent with good banking. 

The First National Bank 
In Munday 

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation 

11111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111  

Farm Needs 
See us for all your farming needs. In 

addition to the every-day needs we have 
in stock, we are featuring this week . . . . 

• Stalk Cutters 

• Sand Fighters 

• Crust Busters 

Reid'sHardware 

Game Time 5:30 and 7:30 

Minor League Plays Friday Night 6:30 

This Schedule Compliments Of 
Ben Franklin Store 

Knox Prairie Seed, Inc. 

Beaty's Grocery 

Charles Baker Insurance 

H & H Tobacco & Candy Co. 

The Children's Center 
Phone 3461 	 Munday, Texas 

111101MillililIMMIIII111111111111111110111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111,  11111111111111M11111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111111M11111 
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and Mrs. B. 0. Norvill. daughters, in Abilene over the 

week end. NEWS FROM VERA 
Mrs. D. E. Alexander and 

daughters visited her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. C. L. Cupp, in Waco 
over the week end. They also 
attended the funeral of her uncle 
on Monday afternoon. 

Mrs. Margaret Jungman and 
son, Mike, of Vernon were guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. H. F. Jungman 
at their cabin on Lake Kemp last 
Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Palmer Campsey 
and sons of Knox City visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Brooks 
Campsey, last Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Offutt and 
daughter of Lubbock visited rela-
tives and friends here over the 
week end. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Cowan and Mays and Mrs. Floyd Searcey at- 
children of Denison 	visited 	his tended the annual singing CM- 
parents, 	Mr. 	and 	Mrs. 	H. 	H. vention in Haskell last Sunday. 
Cowan, over the week end. 

America's first billionaire was 
Mrs. M. A. Masters, Mrs. W. 0. John D. Rockefeller. 

Mrs. James Carden and Mary 
Ann were visitors in Wichita 
Falls last Tuesday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ike West of San 
Antonio visited Mr. and Mrs. Ben 
Tuggle last Saturday afternoon. CHAS. MOORHOUSE 

Cattle - Land - Insurance 

CARD OF THANKS 
Thanks to all our friends for 

the prayers, flowers, visits and 
phone calls w h i 1 e Homan was 
in the hospital. May God bless 
each of you. 

Homan and Dess McMahon 
1te 

MUNDAY PHONE 6811 
Miss Merle Dingus and Henry 

Clay Dingus visited relatives in. 
Comanche last Sunday. sey 

Mr. and Mrs. M. B. Norvill and 
children of Seymour, Mrs. Curtis 
Gollehon and sons of Brownwood 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lemley vis- and Mr. and Mrs. Gene Roland 
ited their son and family, Mr. Haynie and children were Sun-
and Mrs. Jerry Lemle y and day guests of their parents, Mr. 

BENJAMIN PHONE 2181 

C 
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America's newest vacationland 

inspired this superb Summer wardrobe 

by designer Nelly Don. Located in the heart 

of the Southwest, "Six Flags Over Texas," is a 

family recreation park based on the cultures 

of the six flags that have flown over Texas 

Spanish, French, Mexican, Texas, Confederate 

and the U.S.A. See Nelly Don's charming 

interpretation of these fashion influences 

your answer to a travel-in-style 

wardrobe for Summer '63! 

(Mrs. Thelma Lee Coniston) 

Mrs. R. B. Hunt of Throckmor-
ton visited last Wednesday with 
her sister, Mrs. Etta Goodrich. 

Mrs. Faye Shipman of Knox 
City was a recent visitor with 
her aunt, Mrs. R. C. Spinks, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Feemster. 

Billy Dan Richard arrived in 
Dallas Friday night, after flying 
in from Venezuela, to be with us 
father, Rube Richard, who is in 
the hospital. He was accompanied 
by Mr. and Mrs. Robert Train-
ham of Santo to Vera. 

Doss Jernigan is a patient in 
the Knox Count y Hospital in 
'Knox City. Visiting wit h him 
have been his children, J err y 
Jernigan of Kansas, Mrs. Nita 
Hewlett and family of Ft. Worth, 
Mr. and Mrs. Chancy Castle of 
Amarillo, Mr. and Mrs. Ernest 
Ingram of Dallas, and Mrs. Doll 
Parton of Arlington. 

Mrs. R. E. Hughes is still a 
patient in the Bethania Hospital 
in Wichita Falls. Her daughter, 
Mrs. Lois Sullins, has come home 
from college to be with her. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lest e r Kinni-
brugh and daughter, Polly, of 
Lubbock spent the week end with 
Mr. and Mrs. Levoy Kinnibrugh 
and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claudell Bratcher 
attended the Ice Capades in Fort 
Worth last Friday evening. 

Mrs. Clarence Allen of Abilene 
visited Saturday and Sunday 
with her mother, Mrs. Jim 
Hughes, and Mr. and Mrs. E. S. 
Allen. 

Rev. Da v id Crow of Clovis, 
N. M., visited last Thursday and 
Friday with his brother, Rev. and 
Mrs. Douglas Crow and children. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Roberson 
are spending this week with their 
grandchildren, children of Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Roberson, in 
Norman, Olcla. 

S-Sgt. R a y m on d Carroll is 
spending the month with his fam-
ily, Mrs. Carroll and two chil-
dren, after overseas duty on 
Okinawa. On May 20th the fam-
ily will move to Ft. Sill, Oka., 
where Raymond will be station-
ed. 

Mr. and Mrs. Buck Hughes of 
Little Rock, Ark., have been vis-
iting with his brother, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Hughes. 

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Roberson 
of Truscott were Sunday visitors 
in the home of his mother, Mrs. 
J. M. Roberson. 

Rev. Douglas Crow was in 
Norton Sunday where he con-
ducted the funeral of a former 
member. 

Visiting with Rube Richard in 
the hoSpital have been Hardy 
Lee Richard of Denver, Colo., Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles Roberson and 
Jan Richard of Norman, Okla., 
Jackie Hill of Lubbock, Mr. and 
Mrs. Emmett Richard of Spring-
town, .Mr. and Mrs. Lois Richard 
of Dickens. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Tomlinson 
and son, Phil, of Benjamin were 
Sunday guests of her sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Wiles and boys. 

Mrs. Douglas Crow spent the 
week end .at the bedside of her 
mother, Mrs. Foley,-in a hospital 
in Wichita Falls. 

Marianne Coffman of Nor t h 
Texas University in Denton and 
Robert Coffman of Midwestern 
University in Wichita Falls visit-
ed over the week end with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Olen Coff-
man and Eileen. 

Mr. and Mrs. Amos Kinnibrugh 
of Gilliland were Sunday visitors 
of Mr. and Mrs. Billy Kinnibrugh 
and little son. 

Mrs. Julia Knox of Chandler, 
Ariz., and Mrs. Jessie Blackstone 
of Dallas visited Saturday thru 
Monday with their uncle, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Hughes and Mr. and 
Mrs. Quel Hughes and girls. 

Week end visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Fred Hollabough 
and Pa t s y were Mr. and Mrs. 
Claude Funderburk and family 
of Lubbock. 

Mr. and Mrs. ,Goodson Sellers 
visited their daughter and fam-
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Glen Marugg 
and sons, in Woodward, Okla., 
over the week end. 

Jerry Bowden and Miss Ann 
Stockton, students in N. T. S. U. 
in Denton, were week end guests 
of Jerry's parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Levi Bowden. 

4  

The FAIR Store 
1. Mantilla, embroidered eyelet cotton shirtwaist in black, white or brown. Sizes 8 to 18. 22.98 

2. Liberty Belle, knit shirt in a rayon, linen and cotton blend. Blue, natural, green. 8 to 18. 25.98 

3. Little Dixie, -embroidered blend of Dacron* polyester and cotton. Grey, blue, beige. 8 to 18. 22.98 

4. Coquette, cool cotton chiffon, Tebilizede for crease resistance. Blue brown, green. 8 to 18. 17.98 

5. Fiesta, striped sheath in textured Dacron° polyester. Green/orange, blue/rose, grey/melon. 8 to 18.25.98 

6. Texas Rose, sundress and stole in fine cotton satin. Red, blue or yellow border print. 8 to 18. 17.98 MUNDAY, TEXAS 

ALONE 
IN THE 
DARK 

When your lighting fails, don't 
be in the dark about where 
to find an ELECTRICIAN fast. 

)
Look in the 

YELLOW PAGES, 
,.. 	where YOUR 

FINGERS DO 
HE WALKING 

ilk 



Pints 89 
ICED TEA 

PITCHERS 
69c VALUE — 3•QUART SIZE 

49c ICE CREAM 
SWIFT'S PURE 
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WELCOMEBACK 
BASEBALL!  

KIMBELL'S 

PICKLES 
Full Quart 

Sour or Dill 29n 

BOOTH FROZEN 

8-0z.
kg, Fish Sticks P 	9c 

10c 
STYLE 

HAIR SPRAY 
1.49 VALUE 

98c 

KIMBELL'S ALL VEGETABLE 

SHORTENING 
RED 

POTATOES 
10-POUND BAG 

1̀0ilOP AT M SYSTEM 

FRESH VALENTINE 

GREEN BEANS 
POUND 

15' 
FR DUG 

NEW POTATOES 

2 lbs. 

15c 
"M" SYSTEM S 

FROZEN CATFISH 

39c
LIPTON  
TEA 

-POUND BOX 

TASTE-OSEA 

POUND PKG. 

59c 

I 	SUNDAY PUNCH FROZEN 

Orange Drink 6-Oz. 
Can 

KI3IBELL'S 

CHILI 
NO.' 2 CAN 

COTTAGE CHEESE vB: 1 

PURASNOW 

FLOUR 25
-Pound 

1.89 
RDIBELL'S 

MUSTARD 
LARGE JAR 

BORDEN'S 

LIBBY'S CREAM STYLE 

f. 

59c 

3-Pound 
Can 

303 Can 25c 

CORN 
303 CANS 

2 for  29c  

CRISCO 
LE 

GREEN BEANS 

FANCY FRESH 

Green Onions 
BUNCH 

3C 



ANT 

• 

MEATS 
I. 

I.  

4 

PACE TENDERIZED PICNIC 

MSYSTEM SELECT BABY BEEF 

Sirloin  Steak lb.  69c 

HUNT'S 

PEACHES  ,,   
, CAN 

25c C 
• 

59c 

MAXWELL HOUSE 

COFFEE 2  lb. 
Can 

• • _ gal.  SWIFTS PURE 

Ice Cream 

M-SYSTEM SELECT FAMILY STYLE 

BEEF ROAST 	lb. 49c 
M-SYSTEM SELECT BABY BEEF 

CLUB STEAK 	lb. 59c 
' 

•,•4• 

FRESH LEAN AND MEATY Fruit Pies for 

ARIZONA VALENCHI 
I 

Oranges 
4- 

I-ACES GOLD CROWN SUGAR CURED 
• .• I.,: 4,1....  

0 
FOLGER'S 

1NSTANTCOFEFE 
JAR 

99e 
• 

lb. can 
.L'S 300 SIZE CAN 

tK and BEANS 

  

 

•T: 	• • 	. 	• 	S • 

10c 
a 

12-COUNT FAMILY SIZE PKG. 

KRAFT'S 

MIRACLE WHIP 
QUART 

4 

TIL • Pk 
'4. 

4 
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sfRITGIEM 
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LIBBY'S FROZEN 

Peas or Corn pkg. 19c 
• 

BEST VALUE 

TOILET TISSUE 
LIPTON 

INS TANT TEA 

4roll pkg. 29c 
1-OZ. JAR 

4i9c 

BANQUET FROZEN — PEACH, APPLE, CHERRY 

PORK STEAK lb. 	39c 
2 lb. 
pkg. 

C 

  

  

ROYAL STRAWBERRY 

PRESERVES 
GIANT 2 JAR 

89c 
' 	 :7—`iv-•••••-a 	' • 

KRAFT'S 

BAR B-Q SAUCE 
LARGE BOTTLE 

49c IL  BAGS • 	•WIII=11161.1111111115111 

iN LL 

Pound 29c ED NUTS Lv 

SAVE AT M SYSTEM 



Atteatim Guuluatal 

THE MUNDAY TLMES, THURSDAY, MAY 2, 1963 
i relatives in Haskell Sunday and 
attended the district singing con-
vention Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Willie B. Neigh-
bours spent the week end with 
their son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Noel A. Neighbours, in El Paso. 

Mrs. J. C. Morton was in Wich-
ita Falls Sunday to be with her 
daughter and husband, Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Alexander, when they 
celebrated their 25th wedding an-
niversary. 

(More Goree On Page Two) 

interest in Austin, San Antonio 
and Corpus Christi and all re-
ported a wonderful time. Spon-
sors going on the trip were, Mrs. 
Patsy Cooper, Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Jones and Mr. and Mrs. 
Geroge Cotton. 

Goree News Items 
Shahan, T. J. Shahan, Peggy 
Struck. Sponsors were Mr. For-
rest Martin, homeroom teacher, 
and Mrs. Eldon McSwain, Mrs. 
John Bates and Mrs. Barton Carl. Fish Fry Enjoyed on Lake Kemp 

A number of Goree people en-
joyed a fish fry on Lake Kemp 
Saturday evening. Those attend-
ing included, Mr. and Mrs. 
Pierce Tomlinson, Hale Center; 
Mr. and Mrs. LeRoy Brooks, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Steward and 
Tonya, Mr. and ,Mrs. Elkin War-
ren, Mr. and Mrs. Payne Hattox, 
Mr. and Mrs. Phillip Struck and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Taylor 
Allen and Kevin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Morton, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Donnie Coody, of Munday. 

Jackie Beaty Honored 
On Fifteenth Birthday 

Jackie Beaty was honored with 
a birthday party in the city park 
on his 15th birthday on Saturday, 
April 27. Refreshments were 
served to, Buddy Lowrar e, 
Karen Jones, Charles Kidd, San-
dra Lee Hardin, Gussie Mae Res-
sell, Judy Elliott, Wayne Birken-
feld, Roxanna Bates, Jeanne 
Tynes, Tommy Shahan, Beckie 
Green, Carolyn Shahan, Dale 
Jones, and Bill, Sue and Robbie 
Johns of Munday. We are glad to report the im-

provement in the looks of our 
cemetery since our new caretak-
er, Mr. 0. H. Hutchens has been 
taking care of it. 

FFA boys Tommy Cloud, Bob-
bie Jackson, Don Hicks and Mr. 
Marvin Ansley attended the 
grass judging in Lubbock Friday 
and Saturday. 

Visiting in the Lloyd Patter-
son home Saturday evening in-
cluded, Mr. and Mrs. John Brown, 
Debbie and Danny, Weatherford; 
Mrs. R. J. Melton and Margie 
Garner, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Simaichl, Jr., Seymour; Miss 
Shirley Booe, Munday; Mr. and 
Mrs. George Weber, John Poison 
and Mr. and Mrs. Douglas Smith 
and Gordon, Goree. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Cloud and 
family visited Mrs. Cloud's mo-
ther, Mrs. J. A. Hill Sr., in the 
Knox County Hospital Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Willie Bailey of 
White Face visited Saturday 
night with Miss Emma Cooksey 
and Mr. and Mrs. W. M. Cooksey, 
and attended the singing conven-
tion in Haskell Sunday. 

Visiting in the A. A. Brooks 
home over the week end were 
Mr. and Mrs. John Brooks and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Jimmie 
Brooks and son, Mrs. J. H. 
Brooks and Mrs. Roy Barron if 
Mineral Wells. 

Mr. and Mrs. Everett Gaither 
visited her niece and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Pat Martin Jr., and 
family in Rule Sunday. 

Mrs. Bernard Brown and Chris 
and Mrs. Vince Orsak of Rhine-
land visited Mr. and. Mrs. Bill 
Orsak Monday. Mrs. Vince Orsak 
remained for a longer visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tony Hammons 
of Paducah spent the week end 
with his brother and wife, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. R. Hammons and 
with his sister and husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. G. 0. Denham. 

Mr. and Mrs. D. A. Corley of 
Ft. Worth spent the week end 
with Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Green-
wood and family. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Goode of 
Bellevue spent the week end with 
Miss Burniece Goode and other 
relatives here. 

George Crouch of San Antonio 
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Call us for an appointment to have your portrait made 

in the traditional cap and gown. We now have them in our 

own studio for your convenience. 

and family of Seymour, Marvin 
Keuhler of Bomarton, Mr. C. J. 
Stengel and Mrs. F. C. Roy of 
Chico, Calif. 

Mr. and Mrs. B. W. King Jr., 
and family of Graham visited 
Sunday with Mrs. King's parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ira Stalcup. 

Mrs. Grace Reid of Haskell 
speent the week end with Mrs. I. 
J. Troy. 

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Kinni-
brugh and Betty Jo of Vera vis-
ited Mr. and Mrs. Luther Wil-
liams Saturday night. 

Rev. and Mrs. A. N. Motes, 
Mrs. Barton Carl and Mrs. V. M. 
Reeves attended the sub-district 
W. S. C. S. meeting at Seymour 
Thursday. 

Mrs. W. 0. Barnett returned 
home Sunday from several weeks 
visit with her son and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Foy Bane Barnett 
and children in Albuquerque, N. 
M. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Dude 
Coffman last Tuesday were Mrs. 
Coffman's aunt, Mrs. Georgia 
Barron of Orange, and her uncle, 
Walter Childress, and Mrs. Thur-
man Rhoades of Haskell. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. J. Denton Jr., 
and daughters of Knox City vis-
ited Mrs. Denton's sister and hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Billie Moore, 
and with her father, M. T. Cham-
berlain, Sunday. Mr. Chamber-
lain returned home with them 
for a visit. 

Mrs. M a y m e Fitzgerald and 
Mrs. Georgia Maples visited their 
sisters, Miss Stella Cowsar and 
Mrs. Elizabeth Cowsar in Stam-
ford Sunday. 

Miss Glenda Thornton of Lub-
bock spent the last week end 
with her father, Van Thornton. 

Mrs. Sam Portwood and her 
daughter, Mrs. Chipper Culver of 
Round Timber, visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Allen and family last 
Wednesday. Other visitors in the 
Allen home Thursday were Mr. 
and Mrs. James Bowman of 
Hamlin; and Mr. and Mrs. Dewey 
Tolbert of Megargel. 

Dr. and Mrs. C. A. Holcomb 
of Stamford and Rev. and Mrs. 
Raymond Elmore of Jayton vis-
ited Rev. and Mrs. J. W. Baugh- 

JanCharies Studio 

and Heard Crouch and Bill Yates 
visited in the George Crouch 
home Saturday.' 

Mrs. Jack Thomas of Grand 
Prairie and Mrs. James Butler 
of Seymour visited their grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. H. W. 
Moore, Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Brow n, 
Debbie and Dannie of Weather-
ford and Mrs. Raymond Melton 
and Margie of Garner visited rel-
atives here Saturday. Mrs. Mel-
ton and Margie and Mrs. Brown 
attended the gift shower honor-
ing Miss Shirley Booe in Mun-
day Saturday afternoon. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Peterson over the week end were 
their son and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Royce Peterson and Mr. Pet-
erson's brother and wife, Mr. 
and Mrs. Edward Peterson of 
Pasadena. 

Mrs. S. B. Jetton and Mrs. 
Archie Struck attended the sing-
ing convention in Haskell Sunday 
afternoon. 

Airman and Mrs. Jimmie Paul 
Howell and son of Austin spent 
the week end with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Hammons, 
Mrs, Joe Honea and other rela-
tives here. 

Mr. Carl Maloney of Sweet-
water visited Van Thornton and 
other friends here Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Buford Elliott 
and daughter of Seymour and 
Mrs. Martha Sparkman of Ft. 
Smith, Ark., visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Allen and family Friday. 

Rev. and Mrs. A. N. Motes vis-
ited from Thursday until Satur-
day of last week with their 
daughters and husbands, Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Hallford in Lubbock 
and Mr. and Mrs. Garland Moore 
in Spade. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Lane of 
Lubbock are visiting Mrs. Lain's 
mother, Mrs. Clyde Patton, this 
week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Williams 
and Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Williams 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Charles Wil-
liams and family in Abilene Sat-
urday. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. M. Tucker and 
Mrs. W. R. Caldwell met Mr. and 
Mrs. Lester Brown of Golden, Mr. 
and Mrs. Herman Caldwell and 
sons of Vernon and Mrs. Victor 
Caldwell and baby of San Fran-
cisco, Calif., at the Seymour Park 
Monday for a fish fry. 

Visiting in the Joe Birkenfeld 
home Sunday were Mrs. August 
Loran and Carolyn of Rhineland, 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Smystralia 

Hospital Notes 
Mrs. J. H. Blankenship, Knox 

County Hospital, Knox City. 
Mr. Merle Lambeth was a pa-

tient in the Baylor County Hos-
pital from Friday until Sunday 
of last week. 

Mr. Homan McMahon was 
brought home from the Baylor 
County Hospital last Thursday. 
It will be some time before he 
will be able to be up and about 
but he is reported to be improv-
ing. 

Goree Junior High Students 
Make Field Trip 

Students of the Goree Junior 
High School eigth grade class 
went on a field trip to Wichita 
Falls last Friday. The group was 
given a most interesting tour of 
Channel 3 television station and all 
its facilities by Tom Crain. They 
were televised by having their 
group pictures recorded on video 
tape; then were allowed to see 
themselves on the monitor. Var-
ious types of programming was 
explained, and the use of the 
equipment was discussed. 

It was press time at the Times 
Publishing Company when the 
group visited there, and they 
watched the presses roll for the 
afternoon edition. The tour also 
included the editorial, composing, 
and circulation departments. 

Mead's Bakery was next on the 
list, and the group watched the 
production of staple bread items, 
as well as specialty items for the 
air base mess halls. 

The Carnation ice cream and 
milk plant was visited, and the 
students saw equipment used for 
handling milk from the time it 
is brought from the producers to 
the finished product. 

Students making the trip were 
Jose .Andrade, Roxanna Bates, 
Wayne Bfrkenfeld, Cathy Carl, 
LaRue James, Beth Hargrove, 
Gail Harris, Jackie Howry, Ray 
Hudson, Lonnie McSwain, Elva 
Ponciano, Hilda Rocha, Carolyn 

Seniors and Juniors Return 
The Junior and Senior Class 

returned home from their trip 
Sunday. They toured points of 
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man Thursday. 
Mr. and Mrs. H. L. Butler took 

Mrs. Butler's sister, Mrs. Irene 
Ellis, who had been visiting in 
their home, to Ft. Worth Friday, 
where she caught a jet for her 
home in Miami, Fla. Mr. and Mrs. 
Butler spent the week end with 
their son and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Raymond Butler and daugh-
ters in Ft. Worth. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. 0. Lewis and 
Mr. and Mrs. J. J. Smith visited 

FOR RENT 
Charles and Jan Clark Phone 658-6391 Knox City, Texas New Texaco Service Station 

In Munday! 
Dealer chosen will be sent to school 

in Fort Worth at company expense. 
Small investment needed. Good re- 

turns. Excellent opportunity! 

For Information 

Call 658-3082 in Knox City 
—or see— 

McCauley 
Funeral Home 

OXYGEN EQUIPPED 
AIR CONDITIONED 

AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Day Phone 	Nite Phone 
3451 	 3451 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 

KEN CROWNOVER 
Knox City, Texas 
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Corvair Monza Club Coupe 

1.)”:414"Gario... 

Who needs muscles? 
Do you know bow easy it is to take a corner 
with a Corvair or park one? Turn this 
newspaper sideways and it will give you a 
pretty good idea. The wheel handles just 
about that easily. 

The Corvair's engine is in the rear, for 
not only greater traction, but more balanced 
weight distribution. And that's what makes 
the steering so completely effortless. 

The engine is air cooled, too. No radi-
ator. No water or antifreeze. No boiling 
over or freezing up to worry about. It takes 
the weather and the terrain as it comes. 

TRADIN'TRAVEi 
TIME 

AT YOUR CHEVROLET DEALER'S 

So think about those trips to the beach 
this summer, those bright sunny days and 
balmy moonlit nights. 

And besides, looking at it from a very 
practical point of view, it's Trade 'N' 
Travel time right now at your Chevrolet 
dealer's. He's got some beautiful buys. 

But you had better hurry before somebody 
muscles in ahead of you. Spring's here. 
Summer's coming fast. And with these sporty 
good-looking Corvairs selling the way they 
are, he who hesitates will want to kick 
himself. 

CHECK HIS TNT DEALS ON CHEVROLET, CHEVY II, CORVAIR AND CORVETTE 

Charles Hogsett Chevrolet Company 
716 G Street 	 Munday, Texas 	 PMne 2891  

Sandwich Bread 
in handy Poly Bag 

MRS BAIRDPS 
Stays Fresh Longer 



Choose \ 

GRADUATION 
GIFT now 

THE MUNDAY TIMES, THURSDAY, MAY 2, 1963 

Buy, Sell, Rent, Lease or Exchange It Through 
ship in the Knox City Lodge 
since that time. 

Worth visited her sisters, 'Mt and 
Mrs. Lee Isbell and -Mr. and Mrs. 
Alvin Reid and son, several days 
last week. 

oo 

and 
e0n. LOCALS Rhineland 

School News Mr. and Mrs. E. H. Nelson, 
Mrs. Lela Burnison and Mrs. Lee 
Burniion visited Mrs. Emma 
Tyree in Amarillo several days 
this week. The Times Want Ads 

ugh, 
ivith  
Sr 
iaso.  
Tich.  

her 
and 
hey 
an. 

Mrs. J. T. Voss and Howard 
Voss attended the funeral of 
Terry Harrison in Stephenville 
last Tuesday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Moore of 
El Centro, Calif., were visitors in 
the Wylie B. Johnson home last 
week. The Moores came at this 
time for Mr. Moore to receive his 
50 year Masonic pin in cere-
monies of the Orient Masonic 
Lodge No. 905 in Knox City on 
Monday night, April 22. Mr. 
Moore nioNied to California in 
1917 but had kept his member- 

Mr. and Mrs. Ben Yarbrough 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Joe Duke in 
Wichita Falls last Thursday and 
Thursday night. 

SEE US — For picture framing. 
Many patterns of finished pic-
ture molding to choose from. 
George Beaty. 	8-tic 

"EARLY DAYS IN KNOX COUN-
TY"—A book soon to be pub-
lished. It relates the beginning 
of Knox County, it's first little 
towns, schools and churches, 
with many incidents in the 
lives of the settlers, biographi-
cal sketches and lots of pic-
tures. I am taking pre-publica-
tion orders. The price is $6.50. 
Mrs. R. D. Gray, Box 393, Mun- 
day, Texas. 	 23-tfc 

Mrs. R. A. Phillips of Fort 

CLASSIFIED RATES 

First Insertion 	3c per word 
Following Insertions 2c per word 
Minimum Charge _ 	40c 
Classified Display ____60c per in. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Hill and 
Mr. and Mrs. Pat Hill and daugh-
ters spent the week end in Wel-
lington with Mr. and Mrs. Claude 
(Larry Hill and family. LIFE INSURANCE -IS YOUR 

FINEST PROPERTY . . 
Because: Life Insurance t a lc e s 

off you the pressure to save 
through other means for your 
family's future—and your own. 

PAUL B. PENDLETON, Agent 
Genl. American Life Ins. Co. 

REPAIR LOANS — Nothing 
down — 60 months to pay. 
Wm. Cameron & Co. 	26-tfc 

nwrahu 

LET US TALK—To you about 
a new Krause plow. We also 

. have a good stock of Krause 
parts. Egenbacher Implement 
Co., Knox City; Texas. 14-tfc 

nultutial 

FARM 
LOANS 

The 13-B district volley ball 
tournament was held April 22 
and 23 in the Rhineland gym. Dis-
trict title in the boy's division 
went to Rhineland for the third 
consecutive year, and Rochester 
won in the girl's division. 

* * • 
The district 3 4-H elimination 

contests were held at Midwestern 
University in Wichita Falls last 
Saturday. 

Teams entering f r o m Rhine-
land were Janice Kueheler and 
Judy Bruggeman, who won 3rd 
place in vegetable preparation; 
Suzan Kuehler and Dorothy Ed-
rington, in safety, won second 
place and are eligible to attend 
State 4-H Roundup at Texas 
A&M on June 4 to 6th.—Report-
er, Suzan Kuehler. At Q 	ONG STORE 

Activities of The 
Colored People ,IPEPIT•JSIR. 

SUNBEAM TOP QUALITY 'APPLIANCES 
- 	Mixmasters Electric Skillets—Irons 

Waring Food Blender 	Bath Scales, G. E. Spray, Steam and 
Dry Irons, Zenith Clock-Radios—Munsey Toaster, Elgin Cord- 
less Wall Clock, powered by a single flashlight battery for 20 
months. Kitchen Step Stool by Cosco. 

BIUNDAY, TEXAS 

KRAUSE PLOWS—See us when 
In need of these plows or parts 
for your old plow. Egenbacher 
Implement Co., Knox City. 

14-tfc 

EILECTROLUX—Sales and serv-
ice. Clifton Patterson, phone 
6071, Munday. 	31-tfc 

Electric Can Openers: Udico 11.88 
Can-O-Matic 12.88 Choice of Colors 

Woodpecker Woodware—We have a complete stock of this 
beautiful quality merchandise. 

WANTED — A chance to figure 
your next plumbing or wiring 
job. No job too large or too 
small. Jack Clo w di s, phone 
5106. Plumbing and Electric 
Service. 	 44-tic 

I T PAYS TO ADVERTISE 

WALL TO WALL — Carpeting 
and linoleum. Expert work-
manship and popular prices. 
See us for any size job. Boggs 
Furniture. Phone 4171. 27-tic 

PIANOS—A Truck Load of fine 
used and new Pianos will be 
in town next week. If you are 
interested in a Piano at Big 
Savings—Drop us a card—No 
Obligation. 	Up to 38 months 
to pay. McFarland Music Co. 
200 S. Main, Elk City, Okla. ltp 

Perfumes and Colognes by 
Max Factor—Lanvin—Cord ay—Lenel—Yardley Coty 

WOR DRESSMAKING — And 
alterations, See Mrs. Floyd 
Searcey on Tuesdays and 
Thursdays only at The Fair 
Store. 	 - 	51-tfc 

Beautiful Diamond Watches by Elgin and Hamilton  THE BEST BUY ON EARTH 
IS THE EARTH! 

WARM AND RANCH LOANS—
Anywhere in Texas. None too 
large. Quick service. Try us. 

Wallace Moorhouse, Insurance 
Real Estate and Land Loans 

30-tfc 

Jewelite Comb, Brush and Mirrow Dresser Sets 

,Charm Bracelets 
• and Charms 

'WE CARRY—A stock of genu-
ine Krause plows and parts. 
Egenbacher Implement Com-
pany, Knox City, Texas. 14-tfc 

Transistor Radios 
6, 8, and 11 Trans 
istors FOR SALE — New John Deere 

tandem disc with hydraulic lift; 
2-bottom 18-inch m o l d b o a r d 
plow; 2-bale cotton trailer, -in 
good s h a p e, and 8-room 1% 
story house, to be- moved. Joe 
Bailey King, 	 41.3te 

Hair Dryers—sev- 
eral models-  to se- 
lect from. 

—See-- 
NOTICE—I am now agent for 

the Abilene Reporter-News. 
Glynn Weaver, phone 7721. 

ltp 

TOR SALE—Delinted Gregg and 
Lankart 57 cotton seed. Good 
germination. Buddy Urbanczyk, 
Munday, Texas. 	40-6tp Timex Watches 

TOR SALE-4 oz. skein Dawn 
over 100 in stock 

off a 

wool yarn. Reg. 1.29, close out 
price $1. All colors. Also all 
dresses 1/2  off. Hallmark Gro- 
cery. 	 lie 

PALOMINO QUARTER HORSES 
FOR SALE—Several nice palo-
mino quartertype colts for 
sale, one or two year olds of 
the pleasure riding kind, Lots 
of stride, nice steppers. Tall 
and nice fox trotters, no pac-
ers. See me at Munday, Texas. 
I am always glad to show them 
to you. A. A. Smith, M. D. 

FOR SALE—Water pump and 
fixtures. Mrs. Jim Bell. 42-2tp 

WANTED—Lady to stay in home 
with semi-invalid. Phone 5006. 

1tp Max Factor, Lenel, and Royal Stag for Men 
After Shave and Cologne Gift Sets inside ... outside 

paint with Lord or Lady Buxton Billfolds 
with name engraved FREE in gold 

FOR SALE — Two bedr oom 
house, carpet. 132 9th Ave. 
Phone 7351, Don Estes, Jr., or 
2121, Eva Ray Estes. 	434tc 

SCHOOL SUPPLIES — We now 
have in stock 3 dozen pencils and 

pencil caddy for $1.95; cUb-
boards in leatherette folders 
in green, blue and brown. Ideal 
for school. The Munday Times 
Office. 	 11-tfc 

THREE YEARS — Finance plen 
available to you on new Inter-
national tractors and equip-
ment. Horton Equipment Co. 

6-tfc 

NOTICE FORD TRACTOR 
OWNERS — Let us overhaul 
your Ford tractor. Free pick-
up and delivery on major over-
hauls. Also we have several 
good used tractors for sale or 
trade. Gene Wood Tractor 
Sales, Munday, Texas. Phone 
3631. 	 24-tic 

FURNITURE — New and used. 
Nationally advertised brands. 
Convenient terms can be ar-
ranged. McCauley Furniture 
Co. 	 20-tfc 

RADIO AND TV REPAIRS—
Bring us your radios and TV's 
for repairs. We repair any 
make or model, giving you 
prompt service. Strickland Ra- 
dio Service. 	 10-tfc 

LAND BANK LOANS There's 
no better way to finance than 
with a Federal Land Bank loan. 
Low payments—up to 35 years 
to repay—no penalty for ad-
vance payments or payments 
in full. Federal Lank Bank of 
Haskell, Joe Harper manager. 
Offices at Haskell, Seymour, 
Anson. 	 25-tic 

FOR SALE — New 3 bedroom 
house with vented heat, car-
peted, colored bath fixtures, 
mahogany cabinet and panel-
ing, nearing completion. Very 
low down payment. Call 5471, 
Munday, Texas. 	38-tfc 

42ii.'firs.naLe 

to-- 

BUY A FARM 

BUY A RANCH 

MAKE LMPROVEMENTS 

REFINANCING . . . 

J. C. Harpham 

Charles Baker 
—For A— 

John Hancock 
Farm Loan 

Need Money? 

I Low Interest 

Long Term 

if Fair Appraisal 

Prompt Service 

INSURANCE 

SEPTIC TANKS — Pumped out 
Call 2936, Roe Allred, collect, 
Munday, Texas. 	33-tfc 

DRAW COLOR — A maser with 
felt Up. Washable ink, non-
toxic, safe for children's use, 
39c. Advertised in Life. Now 
on sale at The Munday Times. 

44-tic 

NOTICE—We can pick up trac-
tors that need repairs. Horton 
Equipment Co. 	32-tic 

FOR RENT — 3 room modern 
house. Close to school. Clayton 
Wren, phone 3581 or 4311. 

38-tfc 

SCRATCH PADS — We've made 
up a batch of these from odds 
and ends of stock. Sizes range 
from 4x6 to 7x81/2 . Price 10 
cents each, 12 for $1.00. The 
Munday Times. 	12-tfc 

FOR SALE—Two Clifton Wilhite 
evening gowns, size 3 and 8, 
worn one time. Call Mrs. W. C. 
Moss phone 888.2364, Seymour, 
Texas. 	 41-3tp 

ADDING MACHINE PAPER—
now in stock. 25c per roll 
standard size (25-32 in.) The 
Munday Times. 	38-tfc 

PIANO SALE—Our annual piano 
sale has just started. Save up 
to $300 on a new piano. All new 
styles, new finishes.- Also some 
good used pianos. Norsworthy 
Music Center, 1814 Main St., 
Vernon, Texas. 	41-4tc 

NOTICE—We buy used tractors 
and equipment. Gene Wood 
Tractor Sales, phone 3631, 
Munday, Texas. 	39-tfc 

NOTICE—I am dealer for the 
Estey organ. See them at the 
Yarbrough Hotel. Mrs. Ben Yar- 
brough. 	 34-tfc 

FLASH-O-GAS — Soft Water 
Service. Phone 4671, Munday, 
Texas. 	 17-tfc 

WORRIED ABOUT TERMITES 
—If so contact L. C. Searcey 
for free house inspection. 

41-tfc 

FOR SALE — Used living room 
suite, dining room suite, Philco 
refrigerator, gas range, and 2-
;bedroom house to be moved. 
Phone 2583. J. C. Baty, Mun- 
day, Texas. 	 41-tfc 

FOR SALE — Combined hegari 
seed. Tom Cluck. Munday, Tex- 
as. 	 40-tfc 

FOR SALE—My home in Mun- 
day. Dwight C. Key. 	43-4tc 

By Fannie Mae Johnson 

School was well attended at all 
churches Sunday. 

Rev. Wicks came in Saturday 
to be here with his membership.• 
They are loud in their praise to 
they many white friends of the 
Methodist Church for they co-
operation. 

M. J. Johnson and Miss Beat-
rice Brown of Wichita.Talls visit 
his-mother, Mrs. F. M. Johnson, 
Sunday. 

Mr. J. C. Riley was in Wichita 
Falls Saturday night. 

The West 'Beulah membership 
are looking forward to a few 
nights meeting next week. Rev. 
J. L. Shellman of Anson doing 
the preaching. 

Mr. Manuel Dunbar is building 
two rooms on his house. 

Mrs. Octavia Calvin is fixing 
to add another room to her 
house. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clemmy Toliver 
spent Monday visiting in Wich-
ita Falls. 

QUARTER SECTION—For sale. 
NW% of NE% of Sec. 67, 
Block 13, Knox County, Texas. 
65 acres in pasture, balance 
farm land. Half mineral rights, 
producing wells within 11/2  
miles. $100 per acre. Don Funk, 
3122 S. Toledo, Tuls a, Okla. 
Phone RI 2-3203. 	434tc 

FOR SALE —WD-9 tractor,. in 
good condition. Will let re-
sponsible party try it. Price 
$600. 0. 0. Putnam. 	42-2tc 

FOR SALE—Choice lot, on pave-
ment. Mrs. Daisy Looney. 

42-tfc 

Mirrowed Dresser Trays with 24kt electro-gold plated frame. 
No tarnish ever with this item. 

Solid Stainless 55 Piece Service for 8 by Oneida Silversmiths 

Only 19.95 

Hand Mixers—Sunbeam, G. E., and Westinghouse. 

Large Assortment 
Top quality knives 

WATCHES 
Elgin & Hamilton 

$19.95 up 

Anson Tie Tacks 
Tie Bars, 

Cuff Links 

FOR SALE — I always have 
stocker and feeder cattle listed 
for sale. Chas. Moorhouse. tic 

Zenith Portable Stereo Record Players 
Wanted more than any other gift by the High School Gradu- 
ate. Choose from several ZenithQuality Players. 

Electric Razors 
Norelco Fliptop—$15.95 

Norelco Floating Heads--$18.95 
Schick Powers have- —$19.95 

Remington Lektronic I—$22.98 
Remington Lektronic 11—$24.98 

FOR RENT—Five room modern 
house. Close in. C. L. Mayes. Dr. Calvin Gambill 

. . . and the beauty is . . . the beauty lasts! Sheaffer Pen and Pencil Sets, with name engraved FREE. Ex- 
cellent for college. 

CHIROPRACTOR 
Both these fine Jones-Blair Paints have the many desirable 
qualities you've learned to associate with vinyl . . color, 

beauty, durability and washability. They come in beautiful 

ready-mixed colors ... or your own individual colors can be 
selected from more than 900 Jones-Blair Custom Colors. 

Cameras—Kodak, Argus, Polaroid 
Office Hours: 

8:30 • 5:30 Mon. thru Sat. 

Travel Alarm Clocks--Electric Alarm Clocks 
Ideal for the college set 

TUxedo 8.3412 113 W. McLain 
Seymour, Texas 

Hundreds of items of QUALITY MERCHANDISE 
perfect for Mother's Day and Graduation at Polyflos • SATINI 1 

$5.25 GALLON 
For lovelier interiors. Heady to use. Easy 
to apply. No pointy odor. Ultra-washable. 
Dries in 30 minutes. One coat covers. 

Joe's Radio And 
TV Service 

A. L. Smith Drug Long Terms, 51/2 % Rate and 
Ample Funds. New Location 

So. 13th Ave. 
Same Phone Number 

4641 

Makes all types of masonry beautiful 
again ... asbestos shingles, stucco, con-
crete, brick, stone, etc. Won't fade, peel. 
crack or blister. 

Come in and let us tell you about them! 
MUNDAY, TEXAS 

the most complete Drug Store in Knox County Same Prompt Service MUNDAY LUMBER COMPANY 

S5.50 GALLON 

LOST — Somewhere between 
Munday and Knox City, a 
large, boxed, book about Ameri-
can Indians. Please return to 
Mrs. Lee Haymes, Munday. Re- 
ward. 	 ltc 

FOR RENT—Apartment, close in, 
c 1 e a n, desirable, furnished. 3 
large room and private bath. 
Bills paid. Phone 4901, 0. V. 
Milstead. 	 36-tfc 

NOTICE — Coastal Bermuda 
grass sprigs for sale. Custom 
digging and custom sprigging. 
Reneau Farm, Phone 2051. 

42-tfc 

WRITE or CALL 
WILLIAM A. COOPER 

COOPER INSURANCE 
AGENCY 

120 N. Ave. C Olney, Texas 

MONEY 
TO LOAN 

FARMS and RANCHES 
Texas, Okla., N. Mexico 

ATHLETE'S FOOT GERM 
HOW TO KILL IT 

IN 30 DAYS 
If not pleased with strong, in-

stant-drying T-4-L, your 18e back 
at any drug store. Watch infect-
ed skin slough off. Watch healthy 
skin replace it. Itch and burning 
are gone. TODAY at all drug 
stores. 	 434tc 

FOR SALE—Two used air con-
ditioners, 4,000 cfm. Payne Hat-
tox, phone 436.2421, Gore e, 
Texas. 	 43.3tc 
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Sub-District Meet 
Held Here Sunday 

A meeting of the J. 0. Y. sub-
district of M. Y. F. was held at 
2:30 p.m. last Sunday at the First 
Methodist Church in Munday. 
The purpose was to elect new 
officers for the year. 

Jackie Booe of Munday was 
named sub-district president, and 
Stacia Collins was elected song 
leader. Other officers for the new 
year are as follows: 

Larry Bratcher of Vera. vice 
president; Patsy Roden of Sey-
mour, secretary and treasurer; 
Martha K. Waldrip and Jan Sut-
ton of Knox City, publicity; 
Brenda Beck of Vera, fellowship. 
The new officers will be installed 
Monday night, May 6, at the First 
Methodist Church of Roche Vier. 

'Fail' COCKTAIL 
NO. 303 CANS LIBBY'S CRUSHED-CHUNK-TIDBITS 	NO. 211 CANS 

3 for 59c 3 for 59c PINEAPPLE 
• 

HUNT'S 
SLICED -HALVES VES 

Peaches 
NO. 2 Vz CANS 

4 for $1. 

HALF GALLON BORDEN'S ASSORTED FLAVORS • on 11 Me 29c n e 
BIRTH ANNOUNCEMENT 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Lowrance 
of Bellevue are announcing the 
arrival of a daughter on Tues-
day, April 23, 1963. She weighed 
8 pounds and 14 ounces and has 
been named Melissa Kay. Her 
big sister,.Miehel, 4, is very proud 
of her new sister. Grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Jack Clowdis 
and Mrs. Alice Lowrance. 

NABISCO PECAN SHORTBREAD OR 1.1-0Z. BAG 

43c COCOANUT COOKIES 

IMPERIAL 

PURE CANE 

KUNER'S OLD FASHIONED 14-0Z. JAR 

27t Pickles Sweet MR. AND MRS. S. N. REED 
	50 Years Ago Sugar Mr. and Mrs. M. L. Raynes and 

her brothers, R. A. Edwards of 
Dallas - and J i g g s Edwards of 
Weinert, and her father, R. S. 
Edwards of Weinert, attended the 
annual - singing convention in 
Haskell last Sunday. 

5-POUND BAG LIBBY'S GARDEN 	NO. 303 CANS HEINZ 11-0Z. BOTTLES 

49c 2 for 39c CATSUP 2 for 43t PEAS 
Mr. and Mrs. Sied Waheed and 

Nancy visited Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Kouri and family in Sweetwater 
last Sunday. 

PILLSBURY LAYER 

Cake Mix 
BOX 

25c 

FOLGER'S 

Crisco Coffee Mrs. Alliene Hammett of 
Odessa visited her sister, Mrs. ' 
Riley Dell, and family last Sat-
urday. 

3-POUND CAN 

59c Mr. and Mrs. Harold Partridge 
and Mrs. R. C. Partridge visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Stevens in 
Petersburg over the week end. 

ROSEDALE NO. 303 CANS NO. 300 CANS Mr. and Mrs. H. L. Cannon of 
Phoenix, Ariz., spent the week 
end with her mother, Mrs. G. M. 
Roden, and other relatives. 

TOMATOES 	3 for 49c SPI NAC H  3 for 39c 

Kleenex 
EVANGELINE WHOLE Little Gary Gaines of Dallas is 

spending this week with his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. J. R. 
Gaines. 

• 0 3 CANS 

2 for 49c SWEET POTATOES 
BOX OF 600 

39e 

Mrs. Jack Clowdis and Debbie 
visited their daughter and fam-
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Homer Low-
rance and daughters, in Bellevue 
over the week end. 

MRS. '1 LUKER'S 3-POUND CAN 

49c 
48 COUNT 

Shortening TO BE HONORED—Open house . on Sunday, May 5, will bet-held 
to .honor Mr. and Mrs. S. N. Reed of Knox City, above who are 
well known over all this area, on their fiftieth wedding anniversary. 
The event will be held in the Reed home, and visiting hours are 
from 2 to 6 p.m. 

KOTEX Mr. and Mrs. Tom Morton vis-
ited his parents in Burnet last 
Sunday. 	. 

E 
itGIIH ERsNEE X TOWELS 
KLEENEX 

NAPKINS 

2 rolls 39c SUPER or REGULAR 

2 Boxes 69c Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Womble 
of Woodward, Okla., visited his 
mother, Mrs. A. E. Womble, and 
sister and husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Bailey King, several days 
this week. 

10 COI_ T BOXES 

2 for 49c Panhandle Hail Assn. Rates 
GIANT BOX 

DEISEY 

TISSUE 
The only policy in Texas with the "Extra Harvest Ex-

pense Award." 48-hour waiting period. 
2 ROLL PKG. 

25c Fab 49 Mrs. A. B. Warren visited her 
sister, Mrs. Ed Hester, in Has-
kell last Thursday. 

Wheat Rates: 
Knox County 	Haskell County 

Gen. Form, ___8.60 Gen. Form, ___7.60 
10 pct. ded. _ _ _5.60 10 pet. deft _ _ _5.00 

MEATS Mrs. Alice Lowrance is spend-
ing this week in Bellevue with 
her son, Homer Lowrance, and 
family. 

BABY BEEP ARMOUR'S STAR 
Mr. and Mrs. Lyndon Harris 

and daughter of Haskell were 
Sunday 'guests of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tidwell. 

CHUCK ROAST  Pound 49c 
BABY BEEF 

SHOR T RIBS 	Pound 29c 

iirMBURGER 	Pound 49c 
GOLDEN 

0 L E 0 	 2-Pounds 29c 

Bacon P  2 pootitlluid ds  41€ 
82c 

49c  

29c 

39c 

Panhandle Special Cotton 
The only policy available with 25' coverage from stand 

date (regardless of calendar date) to 15th day, then increases 
5% each day, making complete coverage when cotton is 30 
days old. 

Knox County 	Haskell County 
Gen. Form, _ _10.00 Gen. Form, ___7.00 
10% Deduct __7.20 10% Deduct __5.00 

This policy can be switched to Replant Policy in event 
the farmer fails to get an early stand. 24-hour waiting period 
if policy is written before cotton is up. 

Gaylon Allred of Wichita Falls 
visited his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dee Allred, last Monday night. 

WISCONSIN LONGHORN 

CHEESE Pound 

Pound 

Pound 

Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Hill visited 
their daughters, Miss Johnett 
Hill and Mr. and Mrs. Phil Cobb, 
in Abilene over the week end. 

GRADE "A" FRESH 

FRYERS 
Miss Gwen Groves of Snyder 

visited her sister, Mrs. H. D. 
Matthews, Jr., and family over 
the week end. 

ARMOUR'S STAR 

BOLOGNA 
F1310 (6% Replant) 

Mrs. Jim Phillips returned 
home last Monday from a week's 
visit with her son, Coy Phillips, 
and family in Levelland. FRESH FRUITS and VEGETABLES FROZEN FOODS 

BIRDSEYE 

FISH STICKS 3 pkgs. 1.00 

25% coverage beginning May 26 'til June 9, increasing 
10% a day, full coverage at noon June 16th. Both the special 
and FB10 policies are adjusted by the old percentage basis, 
counting 100 stalks of cotton and paying the loss on the 
number of stalks damaged. 

Knox County 	Haskell County 
Gen. Form; ___6.80 Gen. Form, ___6.40 
10% Deduct. _A90 10% Deduct __4.60 

Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Coody 
and children of Farmers Branch 
spent their vacation last week 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Coody. 

FRESH TEXAS 

CORN 6 Ears 29c 

COLONIAL BANANA 

SQUASH 
Mrs.. Drew Morrow returned 

home last Saturday from a visit 
with her daughter and family in 
Odessa. 

Pound 9c CHOCOLATE FUDGE—FRESH BANANA OR 
GERMAN CHOCOLATE 

Broadforni (8% Replant) BEI:0 RED 10-POUND RAG 

39c CAKES each 5 9c Mrs. E. M. Owens left last Sat-
urday for a visit with relatives 
in Fort Worth. 

POTATOES Full coverage June 10th, using plant population adjust-
ment. 

Knox County 	Haskell County 
Geri. form, ___6.20 Gen. form, ___6.30 
10% Deduct. _A.50 10% Deduct. _ _4.60 

Globe Equitable Ins. Co. 
Fort Worth, Texas 

Full coverage June 16th. (8% replant), using plant popu- 
lation adjustment. 

Knox County 	Haskell County 
Gen. form, ___5.60 Gen. form, _ _ _5.35 
10% Deduct. __3.75 -10% Deduct. __3.55 

Miss Patti Roberts spent the 
week end with relatives in San 
Angelo. Two Way Saving TOO LATE TO CLASSIFY 
FOR SALE 	3 (super 92) and 2 

1959 (model 92) Massey Har-
ris combines for less than their 
finance value. Clifford Rhoads, 
Munday, Texas. 	43-2tc 

• DOUBLE STAMPS AND SPECIALS ON TUESDAY 
• LOW EVERY DAY PRICES 

Morton & Welborn 
NOTICE TO BIDDERS 

Knox County will receive bids 
on One New Crawler Tractor 
with Loader, at the County Court-
house, Benjamin, Texas, on May 
13th, 1963, up until 10:00 A.M. 

Specifications can be obtained 
from the County Judge until bid 
opening time. 

L. A. PARKER, County Judge 
Knox County, Texas 

We Reserve The 
Right to Limit 

Quantity 

LEO FETSCH, Agent, Phone 2586 PHONE 3581 Free Delivery 
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