
Legion Plans To 
Enlarge Its Fund 

Raising Campaign 

Plans are being completed by 
Lowry Post No. 44 of the Amer-
ican Legion to enlarge its an-
nual fund raising campaign, it 
was announced this week. 

The finance committee has an-
nounced that special events will 
be held each Saturday during 
December, and the public is cor-
dially invited to attend. Pro-
ceeds from the project will go 
toward improving the grounds 
and building of Lowry Post No. 
44, it was stated. 

Goodfellow Gifts 
This year, instead of having 

boxes and barrels in the differ-
ent business houses in town to 
receive Goodfellow gifts, these 
boxes will be located at the 
special booth on the city hall 
lawn and will not be in the way 
of the various merchants who 
have cooperated so splendidly in 
the past. 

Goodfellow gifts will be dis-
tributed at Christmas time to 
families of the area who would 
otherwise have no Christmas. 

Dr. J. M. Croley 
Is Taking Graduate 

Dentistry Courses 
The University of Illinois at 

Chicago is giving telephone ex-
tension post-graduate courses in 
dentistry in every major city in 
the United States, and Dr. J. M. 
Croye of Munday is attending 
these meetings in Abilene once 
a monthfor a period of several 
months. 

Dr. Croley attended his initial 
meeting recently, and he says 
they appear to be very helpful 
and educational to dentists of 
the area. 

Mrs. Ruth Searcey and Mr. 
and Mrs. Thurman Gulley were 
business visitors in Dallas over 
the week end. While there they 
visited in the home of Mr. ,and 
Mrs. Brice Dobbs. 

Davis Miles of Chicago, Dlin-
ois, is visiting relatives and 
friends here this week. 

Do Your Part 
HELP KEEP 
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Miss America Also Rates 
Title of "Miss Thrift" 

Local Yule Lighting 
Now Being Installed 

American Legion 
To Again Sponsor 

A "Tide of Toys" 
The American Legion, again 

this coming holiday time, will 
carry out its "Tide of Toys" pro-
ject which last year resulted in 
three million toys being deliver-
ed to the have-not children of 
Western European nations and 
the British Isles. 

Bing Crosby, radio and motion 
motion picture star, is honorary 
chairman of the "Tide of Toys" 
campaign. Irving Geist of New 
York City and Drew Pearson of 
Washington. D. C., are honorary 
co-chairmen. Thomas E. Para-
dine of New York City will be 
national chairman of this year's 
activity. Last year's "Tide of 
Toys" propcet resulted in three 
million toys being donated by 
children throughout the United 
States. There were shipped to 
Philadelphia where they were 
loaded on ships which took them 
to the various European ports 
where they were distributed by 
the CARE organization. 

Lowry Post No. 44 will partic-
ipate in this project this year 
and recepticles will be provided 
at the Legion Booth to receive 
these toys. The dates for this 
project will be anounced later. 
Let us all help spread Democ- 
racy to the children of Western 
Europe through this very hum-
ble and simple means. 

Olney To Host 
Albany's Lions 

In Title Game 

Workmen from the West Tex-
as Utilities Company and the 
City of Munday started work of 
installing the v a r i-co 1 o r ed 
Christmas lights Tuesday morn-
in, and soon the City of Munday 
will take on that holiday ap-
pearance. 

Streamers of the lights are 
being strung across the streets 
around the square in a "stag-
gered" form, and the beautiful 
star which has decorated the 
city hall -for the past few years 
is in its place. 

Additional lights are being in-
stalled, covering some three or 
four blocks to the south, east 
and west of the square. Munday 
will be better lighted this holi-
day season than ever before. 

With only 31 days remaining 
until Christmas, Munday's stores 
are expected to begin taking on 
the holiday appearance soon af-
ter the Thanksgiving holiday. 
Many of the stores carrying 
Christmas gifts and toys have 
had these on display for some 
time, but store windows will 
soon be showing the Christmas 
decorations. 

The project of lighting the 
town for the holiday season is 
being sponsored again this year 
by the Community Development 
Association. The lights are ex-
pected to be turned on the latter 
part of this week. 

Well Completed To 
Flow 129 Barrels 

Olney's powerful Cubs, who 
won the District 10-A football 
title with ten straight wins to 
their credit, will be hosts to the 
Albany Lions, winners of Dis-
trict 9-A, next Friday night. This 
is one of the first round play-
offs for the state Class A title. 

The Cubs ground Crowell into 
submission with a 33.6 win last 
Friday night to win their dis-
trict title, while Albany was tak-
ing Haskell's Indians to a grind-
25-14 defeat to cinch the District 
9-A crown. This was a game 
which claimed the interest of 
fans of this area, and nearly 5.-
000 of them were on hand to see 
Albany's Lions victory over Has-
kell. 

Olney is one of eight teams 
with a undefeated and untied 
record. Others are Kermit, Ar-
lington, Mt. Vernon, Lavega, 
Georgetown, Brenham, and Pear-
sall. 

Albany, defeated in non-con-
ference play went through the 
conference play without a de-
feat. 

Knox County 
Hospital Notes 

Hrs. F. Smith 
Dies On Sunday 

At Knox City 

Staolind Oil and Gas Com-
pany has completed its No. 1 
Icelana Clonts well, first Palo 
Pinto strike in Knox County and 
the best producer yet to be dis-
covered in the county. The well 
is located about five miles 
northeast of Knox City. 

The Palo Pinto strike is com• 
pleted to flow 129.72 barrels of 
38 gravity oil daily from 4,175 
to 4,220 feet through 11/64 in. 
choke. Flowing pressure was 
125 pounds and flowing casing 
pressure 225 pounds. 

The company has approxi-
mately 17,000 lacres around the 
wildcat, located near the south 
end of the block. 

All-District 
6-Man Teams Of 

Area Selected 

They were successful in get-
ting permission to discontinue 
this service—after which we no 
longer received first class mail 
or parcel post by rail. That has 
kept us messed-  up worser in re-
gards to when our mail came in 
and went out. 

• • • • 
Then we were in formed this 

Mistletoe, taking outgoing mail 
to the south, would be discon-
tinued. 

Attend Meeting On 
Civilian Defense 

John B. Scott, fire chief; R. B. 
Bowden, fire marshal; E. Y. 
Johnson, water superintendent; 
Felton Raynes, member of fire 
department, and D. E. Whit-
worth, chief of police, attended 
a civilian defense meeting in 
Vernon last Friday afternoon. 

Chile Joe S. Fletcher, assist-
ant director of the Department 
of Public Safety, was in charge 
of the meeting. He spoke on 
duties Jot civilians in cases of na-
tional emergencies, and urged 
cities to organize for action in 
such cases. He said small towns 
as well as large ones would be 
affected in case of an atom 
bomb attack, and urged citizens 
in all towns to organize for ci-
vilian defense. 

Judge J. B. Eubank, Jr., county 
co-ordinator for civilian defense, 
and Sheriff Homer T. Melton of 
Benjamin were in attendance, 
as were representatives from 
Knox City, Seymour and other 
area towns. 

Mrs. Ira Bowden of Baltimore, 
Maryland, visited in the homes 
of Mrs. Florence Bowden and 
Mr. and Mrs. B. B. Bowden for 
a few days last week. 

Mrs. Ben Yarbrough and Mrs. 
W. G. Gaford were visitors in 
Seymour Monday of this week. 

• * * • 

Patients dismissed since No-
vember 13th: 

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Lane, Mun-
day; Mrs. R. L. Anderson, 
Rochester; C. L. Albus, Munday; 
Mrs. M. F. Williamson, Roches-
ter; Mr. John Griffith, Knox 
City; Mrs. Virginia Ramirez and 
baby, Knox City; Jerry Wayne 
Meers, Munday; Mildred Mich-
eals, Munday; J. E. Hunter, 
Munday; Valentin Solas, Roch-
ester; Mrs. Clements Salazar, 
Knox City; Allen Barnett, Knox 
City; Mrs. T. J. Dixon, Throck-
morton; Mrs. Edward Bassedus, 
and baby, O'Brien; Lucile Sim-
mons, Munday; Mrs. T. L. How-
eth and baby, O'Brien; John L.  
Phillips, Munday; Mrs. Jack 
Walker, Weinert; Wanna John-
son, Munday; George McCalles-
ter, Knox City; Jimmy Hunter. 
Munday; Mrs. John L. Jackson, 
Munday; Jerry Chamberlain, 
Goree; Gloria Ann Banner, O'-
Brien; Ronald Myers, Roches-
ter;Mrs. Willis Ea,ley, Idabell, 
Okla.; Emogene Hill, Munday; 
Mrs. Miguel Maldonado and 
baby, O'Brien. 

Patients in the Hospital No-
vember 20th: 

Hugh Rogers, Knox City; Mrs. 
Allen Bell, Munday; F. E. Barn-
ett, Knox City; E. E. Teaff, 
Knox City; J. H. Mansell, Roch-
ester; Baby Lowe, Munday; Mrs. 
P. 0. Large, Knox City; Mrs. 
Tom Cloud, Goree; Mrs. Charles 
Harrell, Munday; Mrs. E. C. Le. 
masters, Dill City, Okla.; Mrs. J. 
D. Rash, Peacock; Mrs. J. W. 
Green, Knox City; Ermine Tid-
well, Benjamin; Clyde Nelson, 
Munday; Mrs. Dave Jetton and 
baby, Munday; Mrs. Llyod Al-
len and baby, Rochester; How-
ard Malcomb Davis, Knox City; 
L. E. Hunter, Goree; Mrs. Chas. 
Reese and baby, Knox City. 

Births: 
Mr. and Mrs. T. L. Howeth, 

O'Brien, a daughter. 
Mr. and Mrs. Juna Reyes, 

Knox City, a son. 
Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Allen, 

Rochester, a daughter. 
Mr. and Mrs. Edwards Basse- 

dus, O'Brien, a son. 
Mr. and Mrs. Miguel Maldo- 

nado, Weinert, a son. 
Mr. and Mrs. Dave Jetton, 

Munday, a son. 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Reese, 

Knox City, a daughter. 
Mr. and Mrs. Apagito Bena- 

vides, a son. 
Mr. and Mrs. R. B. Howell, 

Knox City, a daughter. 
Deaths: 
Mrs. Ed Helms, Knox City. 
Mr. F. M. Harrison, Knox City. 
Mrs. Freeman Smith, Knox 

City. 

And that means, so we are 
told, that sortie of our neighbor-
ing towns interested in receiving 
our publication the same week 
it's published might not be able 
to do so. 

John Ben Shepperd 
Heads Heart Fund 

HOUSTON—John Ben Shep-
perd, Secretary of State, has ac-
cepted the Chairmanship of the 
1951 Heart Fund in Texas, it 
was announced today by Dr. 
GeorgeW. Parson, President of 
the Texas Heart Association. 

Making the announcement at 
a meeting of the Executive Com-
mittee and Board of Directors of 
the Association in Houston to-
day, Dr. Parson said, "Diseases 
of the heart and blood vessels 
are the leading cause of death 
and disability in this counrty. 
The 1951 Heart Fund campaign 
will be conducted next February 
to raise the necessary funds to 
support the greatest effort ever 
made in medical history to find 
the answers to unsolved prob-
lems of heart disease." 

Mr. Shepperd, a past national 
president of the Junior Chamb-
er of Commerce, said, "I accept 
the Chairmanship because of my 
deep concern over the fact that 
heart disease robs us prema-
turely of too many of our most 
able and irreplaceable leadors in 
industry, government, science, 
and other vital fields of endeav-
or." 

Governor Allan Shivers will 
again serve as Honorary State 
Chairman of the 1951 Heart 
Fund. Bruce Barton is National 
Campaign Chairman. 

MRS. HOWELL'S FATHER 
PASSES AT CLARENDON 

Mr. and Mrs. Rex Howell and 
family returned home Tuesday 
from Clarendon, where they had 
been called because of the death 
of Mrs. Howell's father, James 
L. Bain. 

Mr. Bain, who was 82 years 
of age, passed away at a Pampa 
hospital last Sunday morning. 
He was a retired farmer of Don-
ley county. He is survived by 
his wife and five children. 

Funeral services were held at 
Clarendon last Monday. 

• 

Relatives received word here 
last week of the death of Dr. 
Bruce Johnson, young San An-
tonio physician, who succumbed 
to an attack of polio at a San 
Antonio hospital on Thursday, 
November 16. 

Dr. Johnson, a recent gradu-
ate of the Texas University 
School of Medicine, had recently 
established practice in San An-
tonio. 

He was born on September 26, 
1933, and was 27 years of age. 
He was stricken with bulbar pol-
io on October 26, and lived only 
21 days. 

While 

• • • 
"Pony Express would 

quicker," we says. 
be 

-4 

• • * • 

Dissatisfaction has been ex-
pressed in regards to receipt of 
merchandise coming to Munday 
by other methods, too. 

• • • • 
We recently had a freight 

shipment made to us from Mil-
waukee. Wisconsin. We lacked 
only three days being an entire 
month receiving it. 

* • * • 

Our customer was on our 
neck, we were on our depot 
agent's neck, then finally wired 
for tracer proceedings to be in- 
stituted from the point of origin. 

• * • • 
We recently wired, then a day 

or two later, telephoned Fort 
Worth regarding a little ship-
ment that come to us by motor 
freight. 

in medical school, he 
was married to Miss Bettye Mon 
ris, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
R. H. Morris of Munday. 

Survivors include his wife and 
13-months-old son, Charles 
Bruce, and his parents, who live 
in Kalispelle, Montana. 

Chapel services were held in 
San. Antonio on Friday, Novem-
ber 17. Rev. Kenneth Copeland, 
former pastor of the Methodist 
Church in Haskell, officiated. 
The body was taken to Kalis-
pelle, Montana, where funeral 
services and burial rites were 
held on Tuesday, November 21. 

• • • • 

Goree P.-T. A. To 
Sponsor Fun Night 

Monday, November 27, 7 P. 
M., has been set aside as Fun 
Night for the community by the 
Goree P.-T. A. Miscellaneous 
games, including "42", "84", and 
Canasta will be arranged for the 
entertainment of the evening. 
P..T. A. members will furnish 
pie and coffee. 

No admission will be charged, 
but a silver donation will be ac-
cepted. Everyone is invited to 
this fun night. The usual schedule on motor 

freight, we were told, is that 
anytihng leaving Fort Worth or 
Dallas by five o'clock in the af-
ternon should reach us the next 
morning. Yet, we were four 
days getting this shipment. 

• • • • 
Perhaps we've become inclin-

ed to expect too much in these 
days of the fast automobile, the 
giant airplane, and the atom 
bomb! 

Mr. and Mrs. L. W. Hobert 
spent last Friday with relatives 
in Cisco. They were accompan-
ied home by E. R. Hobert, who 
had been visiting his daughter, 
Mrs. Cora Plumlee, in Cisco for 
about a month. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. T. Chamber-
lain and Miss Karin Caughran 
visited relatives in Stephenville 
over the week end. 

0 	• • 

HOME FROM HUNT 

J. L. Stodghill a n d Herbert 
Stodghill returned home Mon-
day from San Saba County, 
where they had been on their 
annual deer hunt. They were 
joined there by J. Arthur Smith 
of Lorenzo. Herbert bagged his 
deer, while the other two were 
unsuccessful. 

ELAINE HARDLN HAS 
A NEW BABY SISTER: 

"I got a new baby sister!" 
This was the greeting we had 

Monday from little Elaine Har-
din, who is here with her grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. G. 
Leflar, last Monday. Then she 
told us about the sister. 

Her name is Suzanne, and she 
arrived at a Shamrock hospital 
on Sunday, November 12, weigh-
ing seven pounds and three 
ounces. Her parents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Guy Hardin of Sham-
rock. 

Grandparents are Mrs. J. C. 
Campbell and Mr. and Mrs. W. 
G. Leflar, all of Munday. Elaine 
is thrilled over her little sister, 
and she's going to have lots of 
fun with her when she gets 
home. 

DAVE JETTONS ARE 
PARENTS OF A BOY 

He made his arrival promptly 
at 1:45 p. m. Sunday, November 
19, at the Knox County Hospital, 
and very soon thereafter he be-
gan to let his arrival be known. 
He weighed eight pounds and 
two ounces. 

He's the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Dave Jetto'n of Munday, and he 
and all his family are getting 
along nicely. 

Perhaps we should all slow 
(Continued on last Page) 

unball -gimes 

Washington, D. C.—Miss Yolanda Betbeze, "Miss America of 1950," 
buys another U. S. Savings Bond from her home-town citizen, Congress-
man Frank Boykin of Mobile, Ala. She had already tucked away her 
$5,000 Atlantic City prize money in Savings Bonds. The purchase was 
made on the Capitol steps while Miss Betbeze posed for the newsreels. 
This followed a luncheon given in her honor by Rep. Boykin in the House ' 
private dining room. Shown 1. to r.: Congressman Boykin, "Miss Amer-. 14 
Ica," and Senator Lester Hill of Alabama. 

2,037 Texans To 
Enter Service 

In January 
AUSTIN—State Selective Ser-

vice headquarters received a call 
today for 2,037 men to be induct-
ed into the armed forces in Jan-
uary, Lt. C o 1 . Morris S. 
Schwartz, deputy state draft di- 
rector, announced. 

Announcement of the receipt 
of the January call was made 
by Colonel Schwartz in the ab-
sence of Brig. Gen. Paul L. 
Wakefield, state director, who is 
in Washington attending a con-
ference of state draft directors. 

Local board quotas for the 
January call will not be made 
up until the early part of De-
cember, Colonel Schwartz said. 

The January call of 2,037 
compares with a call of 2,008 for 
December and brings the num-
ber of men called for since the 
beginning of the conflict in Ko- 
rea to 12,525. 

The 2,037 Texans called for in 
the January induction period is 
the state's share of a national 
quota of 40,000 announced sev-
eral days ago by the Depart-
ment of Defense in Washington. 

Calls are made by the Secre-
tary of Defense on the director 
of Selective Service in Washing-
ton, Maj. Gen. Lewis B. Hersh-
ey, who allots quotas to the 
states on the basis of federal 
draft law regulations. State 
draft directors under these same 
regulations allot quotas to their 
local boards. 

The deputy state director of 
Selective Serive described Texas 
as being "in good shape to sup-
ply men to fill the January 
quota." He said that the state 
Selective Service System "has 
more than enough men examin-
ed and acceptable to fill the No-
vember, December and January 
quotas." 

Call for November, now being 
filled, is the highest received so 
far by Texas, a total of 3,453. 

Department of Defense an-
nouncement from Washington 
several days ago said that the 
January quota would have been 
larger if the Army were suffic-
iently prepared to take care of 
the inductees. 

Kracker Krumbs  
Odd Bits Salvaged  

At Random 

• • • • 
Now, what happens to them 

in the interim? 
• • • • 

That's the question we can't 
answer, and our very efficient 
post office workmen can't ans-
wer. 

• • • • 
Last week, we were informed, 

one of our afternoon Mistletoe 
carriers would be taken off. It's 
the one that delivers and picks 
up local mail around 4:45 in the 
afternoon. 

• • • • 

Nail Picker Here 
During Last Week 

The magnetic nail picker of 
the Texas State Highway De-
partment which was pictured 
in this paper several weeks ago, 
arrived here last week and did a 
good job of covering some of 
this territory. It covered the 
lake road twice, sweeping the 
road and road shoulders in this 
area of metal objects. 

Electric magnets at the rear 
of the nail picker collected loose 
metal objects. The magnets are 
activated by a truck and are 
strong enough to pick up man-
hole covers. 

John Nations is director of 
the equipment and Joe Webb of 
San Angelo is the driver. After 
leaving here the nail picker 
went to Knox City. 

Miss Gwyna Lee and Lyndol 
Smith, who are attending Baylor 
University at Waco, came in 
Tnuesday of this week to spend 
the holidays with their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Smith. 

Billy J. Roberts of Fort 
Worth visited friends and rela-
tives here and at Goree over the 
week end. 

It appears that every change 
in mail service for Munday has 
been for the worse. 

• • • • 
Back yonder, when passenger 

trains still ran on the Wichita 
Valley, they changed schedules. 
That kept us messed up on when 
our mail would arrive and go 
out for some time. 

• • • • 
Tne officials decided operation 

of pasenger trains along the line 
w a s losing them plenty of 
money. 

• • * • 

Mrs. Freeman H. Smith, 32, a 
resident of Abilene for three 
months, passed away last Sun-
day at the Knox County Hospit-
al. 

Mrs. Smith was a resident of 
Knox City for some 14 years be-
fore moving to Abilene. She 
passed away at 9:25 a. m. after 
an extended illness. Her hus-
band is an oil well driller. 

Funeral services were held at 
2 p. m. Monday from the Four-
square Gospel Church in Knox 
City, with Rev. Floyd Bailey, 
pastor, officiating. 

Survivors include her hus-
band; a son, by a previous mar-
riage, Paul Sanders of Abilene; 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. H. C. 
Jones of Pittsburg, Texas; a 
brother, A. C. Jones of Pitts-
burg, and a sister, Mrs. Charles 
Kisner of Abilene. 

Dr, Bruce Johnson, 
Victim Of Polio, 
Dies November 16 

All district teams for area 
towns playing 6-man football 
were selected recently, according 
to an announcement made by 
S. E. Reed, superintendent of 
the Benjamin Public Schools 
and 13th District chairman. 

Players selected on the teams 
are as follows: 

First team: Backs, Robinson 
of Knox City, B. Hardin of 
Vera and Young of Benjamin; 
center, tie between Atkinson of 
Goree and Smith of Knox City; 
ends, tie between Reeves and 
Wilson of Knox City and Lam-
beth of Goree. 

Second team: Backs, Joe Nun-
ly of Benjamin, May of Knox 
City and Lambeth of Goree; cen-
ter, R. Hardin of Vera; ends, 
Feemster and Ritchie, both of 
Vera. 

Teams were selected by a vote 
of the coaches and players of 
Knox City, Vera, Goree and Ben-
jamin. 

Knox City won the champion-
ship of District 13, Vera was 
second, Goree third and Benja-
min fourth. 

New Well Going 
Down Near Munday 
Another wildcat is to be drill-

ed about four miles south of 
Munday. Machinery was moved 
in last week and was being set 
up this week in preparation for 
drilling. 

It is the Anderson and Pritch-
ard Oil Corporation No. 1 Maude 
E. Harber, which is located on 
the land owned by Mr. and Mrs. 
J. T. Halter. 

The 5,100 rotary project is 
660 feet from the south and 467 
feet from the east lines of the 
southwest quarter of Section 
145, Block 45, H&TC Survey. 

"The mall must go through!' 
• • * • 

That cry of Pony Express 
days seems to have vanished in-
to extinction, so far as some sec- 
ond class matter is concerned. 

• * • • 
And your newspaper is second 

class matter. 
• * • * 

A number of times we've had 
complaints from some subscrib-
ers, former residents of Knox 
County, out Lubbock way, that 
they don't get their Thursday's 
paper until the following Mon- 
day. 

 

• • * • 
Sometimes the same situation 

has prevailed for our readers 
who get their mail on a rural 
route out of Knox City. 

• • • • 
Then last week, we had a com-

plaint from a reader at Trus-
cott—he wasn't getting his pa- 
per until Monday. 

• • • • 
We inquired about the matter 

at the post office and were as-
sured that the papers went out 
of the Munday office the same 
day they were mailed—Thurs- 
day. 
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EDITORIAL PAGE Uncle 8,31n Says 

Attention 
Car and Truck Owners! 

We have just received a supply of per- 
manent anti-freeze in these popular 
brands: 

• PRESTONE 
• ZEREX 

• MOPAR 
Get your winter's supply while our 

stock lasts. 

MUNDAY TRUCK & TRACTOR CO. 
"The FARMALL House" 

"What a Man Does For Himself Dies With Him— 
W hat He Does For His Com munity Lives on and Om" Mr. and Mrs. Clay F. Grove 

returned home last Friday from 
Malvern, Hot Springs, Little 
Rock and other points in Arkan-
sas, where they visited relatives 
for several days. 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 

In first zone, per year 	 $2-04 

In second zone, per year 	 $2.50 

• 

Bobby Winchester, who is at-
tending Hardin-Simmons Univer-
sity in Abilene, visited in the 
home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tolby Winchester, over the 
week end. 

Mrs. Aaron Edgar spent the 
week end at Quanah visiting her 
father, W. J. Bridge, and with 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Rogers. 

The Munday Times Is Democratic, yet suppottUtg only what It 
behoves to be right, and opposing what n believes to be wrong, 
regardless of party policies. publishing news fairly. impartially. The Munday Times 

Published Every Thursday at Munday 
Aaron Edgar and Grady Roberts . 	Owners 
Aaron Edgar 	 Editor and Publisher 

Entered as second class matter January 4, 
1919, at the postoffice in Munday, Texas, under 
Act of Congress, March 2, 1879. 

BOXY 
NOTICE TO =31 PUBLIC: Any erroneous reflection upon the 

charaoter, standing, or reputation of any person, firm or cor-
poration which may appear in the columns of this paper, will be 
gladly oorrected upon due notice being given to the publisher, at 
the ?Sunday Times office. 

In the manner of your Navy—
"NOW HEAR THIS": You can build 
up assets of S4,329 cash in 10 years 
by adopting a single 3-step plan for 
saving money. Briefly: decide to start 
saving now, before you even touch 
your pay — save systematically, a 
definite small sum each week—save 
automatically.  `enroll today for the 
purchase of U. S. Savings Bonds by 
the Payroll Savings Plan where you 
work. IT'S JUST THAT SIMPLE. 

U. S. Treosury D:portmeni 

OUR NEEDS FOR 1950 
L Completion of our portion of the Throck-

Marton road, giving the farmers of that area an 
all-weather outlet 

2. A farm-to-market road to the north and 
east of Munday, possibly connecting with the Hef-
ner road. 

a A U. S. Federal building. Munday needs 
a new post office home. 

4. More homes in Munday. We did a good 
job in 1949, but there's still a housing shortage. 

5. A new telephone system, giving the town 
adequate telephone service and tapping the rural 
area surrounding the town. 

6. Greater cooperation of business man, farm-
er, and citizen toward long-range development for 
our community. 

Movies Are Better Than Ever 

LET WASHINGTON SET EXAMPLE 

A great many people noticed a glaring omis-
sion in President Truman's recent radio broad-
cast setting forth the steps which must be taken 
to meet the present emergency. He said: "This 
defense program cannot be achieved on the bas-
is of business as usual. All of us—whether we 
are farmsr, or wage earners or business men—
must give up some of the things we would or-
dinarily expect to have for ourselves and our 
families . . . . We are all in this situation togeth-
er. We must be prepared to accept some re-
ductions in our standards of living." 

Mr. Truman merely stated what the average 
individual expects to do in times of stress. The 
thing he completely failed to mention was any 
retrnechment in the reckless domestic spending 
of the Federal government and every bureau 
connected with it. 

The defense program and the morale of the 
taxpayers, who are being bled white, would be 
greatly encouraged if some of the public ser-
vants in Washington would ask for a cessation 
of "politics as usual" when they ask for a cess-
ation of "business as usual". It is no sacrifice 
for any business or any family to scrimp and 
save and do everything they can to help provide 
for their boys who are taken up by the armed 
forces. But it is a tremendous sacrifice to 
scrimp and scrape and cut down on actual ne-
cessities in order to pay taxes to maintain an 
ever-growing army of bureaucrats and public of-
ficials who are constantly looking for new ways 
to spend money for domestic schemes which put 
the government deeper into businss at the ex• 
pens of the private citizen. 

The President's talk lacked the ring of sinceri-
ty when he failed to include government in his 
demand for so-called "sacrifices" and "reduc-
tions in our standard of living." 

LOCALS at Burkburnett and Petrolia and 
have been held as Community 
Chest drives in Wichita Falls, 
Vernon and Childress. The last 
three cities are providing more 
than $30,000 of the Council bud-
get of approximately $50,160. 

Finance drive dates for the 
latter part of the month include 
Bowie, November 21, George 
Rucker, Chairman; Saint Jo, 
November 22, Clyde Yetter; 
Ringgold, November 22, Newt 
Sewell; Nocona, November 28, 
J. D. McElhamon; Seymour, No-
vember 28, C. R. Matthews, 
Munday, November 28, Fred 
Broach, Jr.; Benjamin, Novem-
ber 28, W. P. Ward. 

Representatives (from many 
of the Council communities last 
week end completed a special 
course at Midwestern Universi 
ty campus to train them to teach 
the basic Scoutmaster's Train-
ing classes. 

They include D o n Short, 
Burkburnett; Paul Taliaferro 
and Glenn Moore, Bowie; Lon 
nie Rickets and Gene 0. Vaughn. 
Senior Field Scout Executive, 
Vernon; Monte Garrison, Harv-
ey Young and Dave Tunnicliff, 
Quanah; Jim Bob Bigham and 
Jack Bratton, Paducah; Robert 

Friday, Nov. 24 
Saturday Matinee 

Allan (Rocky) Lane and 
Eddy Waller in . . . 

"Covered Wagon 
Raid" 

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Jolly and 
son, David, returned to their 
home in Hilsboro last Saturday 
after a week's visit with Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee Haymes and other rel-
tives. Mrs. Haymes took then 
to Hillsboro. 

Area Scouts 
Make Plans For 

Finance Drive 
—Also Chapt. 1— 

"JAMES BROTHERS 
OF MISSOURI" 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Yost and 
Shirley and Ronald Clyde at-
tended the football game in Ab-
ilene between Hardin-Simmons 
and West Texas State last Sat-
urday. 

IMMI•m•1••=• 

Preceded by a great Boy 
Scout parade through down-
town Wichita Falls at noon, the 
1951 Scout-O-Rama of the 
Northwest Texas Council, Boy 
Scouts of America, will be pre-
sented at Coyote Stadium in 
Wichita Falls Saturday, April 
28. 

Scout-O-Rama plans were an- 
ure 	2,500 b o y s—Cubs, B o y 
Scouts, and Explorers—demon-
strating Scouting skills in 150 
different booths spread out over 
the practice field and parking 
area at the stadium Shows will 
be given from 2 to 4 and 7 to 9 
p m. 

School bands will assist in the 
parade and a chuck wagon feed 
is to be given for all partici-
pants at 5:30 p. m. 

Scout-O-Rama plans weer an-
nounced by the Council Office 
as drives to help finance the 
1951 budget got under way in 
four more Boy Scout communi-
ties in northwest Texas. 

The four cities with opening 
date of the campaign and the 
campaign and the Chairmen 
are: Henrietta, Tuesday, Novem-
ber 14, Bill Middlebrook; Elec-
tra and Kamay, Tuesday even-
ing with Ray B. Dickey, and W.  
M. Sparkman as leaders; Pa-
ducah, Thursday, Novmeber lb, 
Carroll Robertson. 

W. H. Wright and W. S. 
Broday of Vernon, Chairman 
and Vice-Chairman of the Coun-
cil Campaign, accepted invita-
tions to the Kamay-Electra Joint 
kickoff dinner. 

Campaigns opened last week 

Saturday, Nov. 25 

THE COUNTRY PRESS SAYS 

PLACER, CALIF., HERALD: "Some of our 
own citizens are communists at heart, working 
within the framework of o u r constitutional 
rights to destrop our republican form of govern-
ment." 

EPHRAIM, UTAH, ENTERPRISE: " . . . Had 
more attention been paid to the nation's safety 
and less to changing the American way of life, 
to some 'ism' borrowed from Europe, there 
would have been no Korean war with its huge 
lists of American casualties." 

GREAT FALLS, MONTANA, LEADER: "The 
American people are, of course, for prepared-
ness. They are willing to make sacrifices for 
that purpose. They are ready to submit to such 
controls as circumstances may make necessary. 
But surely they are not unreasonable in expect-
ing the government to participate with them in 
the program." 

BROOKHAVEN, MISS., LEADER-TIMES: "It 
seems increible that an alien political philosophy 
such as socialism, could creep up on a people 
who despise it but that is just what is happen-
ing (here) at an accelerating pace. It is time 
the self styled 'liberals' leading the parade be 
asked for an accounting . . . Active citizens feel 
that it is time now for us to put the (X) mark 
on the left wingers before they put the double 
(XX) on all of us." 

WILMINGTON, DELA , RECORD: "The Sep-
tember issue of the Montly Labor Review, offic-
ial publication of the U. S. Department of Labor, 
shows that Labor is continuing to make record 
gains under the Taft-Hartley Act, now in effect 
for three years." 

HAVRE DE GRACE, MARYLAND DEMO-
CRATIC LEDGER: "The oil industry has met 
every challenge during the history of its opera-
tions and now stands ready and well prepared to 
ace the future demands with confidence." 

ITS THE TECHNICOLOR SPECTACLE 
THAT BLAZES THE TRAIL FOR 

• • ALL SCREEN ADVENTURE! 

Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Goolsby 
attended the Hardin-Simmons 
and West Texas State football 
game in Abilene Saturday. •;;,-\C" 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee Haymes vis-
ited with relatives and friends 
in Stamford last Sunday after-
noon. 

Mrs. Jack Hensley and daugh-
ter are visiting relatives in Dal-
las this week. 

t 

L. Thompson and E. S. Burnett, 
Seymour; E. L. Goolsby, Mun-
day. 

The course was written and di-
rected by Ed Oglesby, veteran 
Scouter and woodsman of Wich-
ita Falls. 

Also "EIGHT BALL 
BUNNY" 

Sunday and Monday 
November 26-27 

"The vital prinicple which every legislator and 
government executive should keep in mind at all 
times is that untrammeled competitive price is 
the only force yet discovered which is powerful 
enough to direct production into the channels 
which will best serve the public."—Willford L 
King, Chairman, Committee for Constitutional 
Government, Inc. 

SUN-SET 
Drive-In Theatre 

It's a winner! It's the jack-
pot of laughs! 

"The 
Jackpot" 

Starring James Stewart, 
Barbara Hale a n d James 
Gleason. 

One of the heights of disappointment is reach-
ed when a friends of long duration drops backs 
into the limbo of mere acquaintances. 

Last Times—Friday, Nov. 24 
STARTLING! 

STAGGERING! 

"Mighty Joe 
Young" 

With each hundred pounds of cotton fiber, the 
cotton plant yields approximately 180 pounds 
of cottonseed. Also "TARTS and 

FLOWERS" Saturday Only—Nov. 25 
MARK STEPHENS 

—in_ 

"Sand" 

Some people wake up and find themselves 
famous; others remain out nights and become 
notorious. 

Tuesday, Wednesday 
and Thursday 

November 28.29-30 Most vacationists go away for a little change. 
but come back with a lot less. 

There is considerable difference between sub-
stantial food and lovely refreshments. Dr. W. E. Ponder 

Optometrist 

Sun.-Mon.—Nov. 26-27 

LORETTA YOUNG 
CELESTE HOLM 

—in-- 

"Come To the 
Stable" 

REMEMBER 
Northeast Corner of Square 

HASKELL, TEXAS 
Hours: 9 a. m. to 5 p. m. 

TELEPHONE 431-3 
J. C. Harpham DR. J. DOUGLAS 

LOVELADY INSURANCE, LOANS, REAL 
ESTATE MEP' 	 

Home Furniture Co. 
& Mattress Factory 

Office Phone 24 
Res. Phone 142 

CHIROPRACTOR 

—X-RAY— 

Lady Attendant 
800 North Main 

Phone 215-J 	Res. 294W 
SEYMOUR, TEXAS 

Unice Closed 
on Thursdays 

Office Hours: 
9-12 2-6 

Tues.-Wed.—Nov. 28-29 

The Great Hatfield- 
McCoy Feud! 

"Roseanna 
McCoy 

with FARLEY GRANGER 

R. L. Newsom 
M. D. 

PHYSICIAN & SURGEON 

—For Your Mattress Work— 
We also have a nice stock of 

New and Used Furniture. 
MUNDAY, TEXAS Dr. Fidelia Moylette 

CHIROPRACTOR 
Phone 141 	 Munday, Texas 

Thurs.-Fri.—Nov. 30-Dee. 1 
JAMES CAGNEY 
VIRGINIA MAYO 

—in— 

"White Heat" D. C. Eiland 
M. D. Plus "CAMPING WE 

WILL GO" 

Dr. Frank C. Scott 
Specialist on Diseases 

and Surgery of 

Mahan Funeral 

Home Deposits Now Insured 
Up to $10,000 

ALWAYS A CARTOON FOE 
THE CHILDREN 

it 	 PHYSICIAN & SURGEON 
EYE, EAR, NOSE, THROAT 
AND FITTING OF GLASSES 

AMBULANCE SERVICE 
HASKELL, TEXAS 

Office in Clinic Bldg., 1 Block 
North and % Block West of 

Haskell Nat'l Bank. 

Day Phone 
201 

Nile Phone 
201 In Stock MUNDAY, TEXAS Federal Deposit Insurance is a service 

supplied at bank expense. Each depos- 
itor of our bank is now insured up to a 
maximum of $10,000 f o r all deposits 
held in the same right and capacity. This 
'became effective September 21, 1950. 

TEXAS MUNDAY, 

REMEMBER A Ready Market For 

Your Stock 
cArtLE .. HORSES . . HOGS .. MULES 

Our Sale attracts more Buyers than 
any Livestock Sale in this Territory! 

AUCTION SALE EVERY TUESDAY 
Lots of buyers are on hand to give highest 

market prices for your livestock. 
WB BUY HOGS MONDAYS AND TUESDAYS, PAYING 

YOU 50c UNDER FORT WORTH PACKER PRICES. 

Good management, sound bank super- 
vision, and the security of deposit insur- 
ance work together to safeguard your 
deposits with us. 

WHITE 

AUTO STORE 

for 
Household supplies, auto ac- 

One Minneapolis-Moline tractor 

with 4-row equipment . 

$850.00 

Hughes-Dayton Implement Co.- 
Sales—J. I. Case—Service 

The First National Bank cessories, motor oils, radios, 

record players, Leonard re-
frigerators, stoves, bolts, tools, 

hardware, batteries and vene-

tian blinds. 

IN MUNDAY 

Member Depositor's Insurance CoPporation Munday Livestock Commission Co. 
Ratliff & Son 	 Bill White, Auctioneer 
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Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Spann at-
tended the Hardin-Simmons and 
West Texas State football game 
in Abilene Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Forrest Jackson 
of Fort Worth spent the week 
end in the home of Mrs. Jack-
son's parents, Rev. and Mrs. J. 
R. Bateman. 

Mrs. Dan Billingsley of Wich-
ita Falls and Mrs. Bill Billings 
ley of Odessa visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. M. L. Bill-
nigsley over the week end. Texas Venture rte.\  al 	IS\  

Billy Cammack, who is at-
tending West Texas State Col-
lege in Canyon, attended the 
football game in Abilene Satur-
day and then came home to 
spend the remaining week end 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bryan Cammack. 

Weekly Health 
LETTER 

Issued by Dr. Geo. W. Cox 
M. D., State Health Officer 

of Texas 

In Education • 1876-1951 
Our first state college —Texas A. and M. is now 

in its seventy-fifth year 666 
11QUID OR 

ABUTS 

GIVES 
FAST 
RELIEF 
when COLD 
MISERIES STRUM 

M. L. (Doc) Barnard and Har-
vey Lee left Sunday for Okla-
homa to spend a few days deer 
hunting. 

Let us /CLEAN and 

TREAT your wheat 

LOCAL and LONG 
DISTANCE HAULING 

I am equipped to take care of you lo- 
cal and long distance hauling---day or 
night. Headquarters at Munday Truck 
and Tractor Company. 

Dee Mullican 
• 

Phone 61 	 Munday, Texas 
YOU LOSE WHEN smut hits your wheat. 

To pt • harvest of clean grain, let 
us treat your seed with "CERESAN" 
when we clean it. 

"CERESAN" generally controls stinking 
smut of wheat, as well as smuts of oats 
and barley. Usually improves germi-
nation and seed!ing vigor. See us to 
get your teed grain treated right, at 
low cost. 

Hays your seed treated 
e  whoa yor have It cleaned. 

Cotton I 
Trailers 

Francis Feed & Mill 
Phone 128-J 	 Seymour, Texas 

Believing that every Texas boy of outstanding ability should have a 
chance to get a college education if he really wants one, former students 
of the A. and M. College of Texas five years ago made up a fund to 
finance their first Opportunity Awards. They offered any Texas boy 
who graduated from high school with an excellent record and who could 
not go to college without financial assistance a chance to win a scholar-
ship paying $200 to $400 a year plus a student job if he needed it, to 
help him through college. Selections were made on the basis of scholar-
ship, character and need, with a competitive examination as the deciding 
test. Sixteen boys won Opportunity Awards the first year and have 
graduated from A. and M. with outstanding records. Many Texas leaders 
have become interested in the plan and have given scholarships. This 
year there are 200 Opportunity Award boys in school at A. and M., 
from all over the state. One of the newest of these scholarships was 
financed by gifts from the current student body of the college. 

We still have in stock a few of those 
quality Barrentine cotton a n d grain 
trailers at the old price. 

These trailers a r e equipped with 
springs, Timken bearings and 650x16 
tires. Come in and see them. 

the hill, and he took his old hat 
in his hand and yelled, "Come 
on, boys, let's get them red-
sikns!" 

The Indians, thinking he was 
calling to a bunch of Texans 
with their rifles, turned and ran 
away. His nerve and his fast 
thinking saved the pioneer's 
life. 

EAR 
fiffiyilakia 

GIVES YOU 

Men 

Special $199.50 Complete 

Munday Truck and 
Tractor Company 

The FARMALL House 

AUSTIN—A delayed report 
from the United States Public 
Health Service communicable 
disease center in Atlanta, Geor-
gia, credits the Texas State 
Health Department Bureau of 
Laboratories here with top score 
in national competition in iden-
tification of intestinal parasites. 

Two grades were awarded 
during the evaluation studies 
which are designed to raise the 
standard of laboratory accuracy. 
One was for the abaility to cor-
rectly identify Enbomoeba 
tolytica, an interstinal parasite; 
the other for a correct determin-
ation of the presence or absence 
of all intestinal organisms. 

The report said the Texas lab-
oratory had tied for first place 
with three other state health 
departments in the first test, 
and had won a clear title to top 
honors in the second. 

Forty-two state and territorial 
laboratories competed in the 
year-long evaluation studies 
which began in July, 1949. The 
scores were announced last 
week. 

Laboratories tying Texas in 
the first test could not be iden-
tified. Code numbers known 
only to the referee laboratories 
are used to designate the partici-
pants in the studies. Texas' 
code number was 13. 

A total of 110 speciments were 
examined. Twelve specimens 
were elminated from the study 
because even the experts at the 
referee laboratories could not 
agree on what organisms they 
contained. 

The communicable disease 
center gave Texas' laboratory 
spcialists a grade of 98.9 percent 
on the first test, and 97.5 per-
cent on the second. No other 
laboratory in the United States 
proved to be so accurate, 

Authorities of the State De-
partment of Health said they 
have now begun intra-state lab-
oratory studies, conducted on 
the same basis as are the nat-
ional studies. In the intra-state 
examniations, laboratories oper-
ating with the state are tested 
for accuracy in determining 
what organisms are contained 
within a given specimen. 

Bring your car in today, and 
get the benefit of these three 

protecting services ... 

The Whitewright Sun has dug 
up that old time sketch in 
which an editor tells how he 
whipped an indignant subscrib-
er. The editor makes use of the 
editorial "we" in speaking of 
himself. 

"There was a blow; some-
body fell. WE got up. Turn-
ing upon our antagonist, we 
succeeded in winding his arms 
around our waist and, by a 
' quick maneuver, threw him on 
top of us, bringing our back at 
the same time in contact with 
the soild bed of the printing 
press. Then, inserting our nose 
between his teeth and cleverly 
entangling his hands in our 
hair, we had him." 

C 

Joe and John Spann, who are 
attending West Texas State Col-
lege in Canyon, visited in the 
home of their perants, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. C. Spann, over the week 
end. 

eeing is 
believing 

Correction of Steering Difficulties, 
eliminates the chief causes of shim-
my, road-wander, wind-dive, tram-
ping, and accident-breeding fatigue. 

LONGER TIRE LIFE .... 

no other range is as fast 
or as efficient 
as a modern gas range 

Mr. and Mrs. Wendell Par-
tridge attended the football 
game between Hardin-Simmons 
University a n d West Texas 
State College last Saturday. 

How about a true story about 
a pioneer Texan whose fast 
thinking saved his life? Down 
near Austin is a beautiful spot; 
it is called Barton's Spring and 
was named for "Old Man Bar-
ton", as everybody called him. 

One day, he was walking 
through the forest not far from 
his home when he saw five or 
six Indians. They saw him at 
the same time and they began 
chasing him. They were on 
foot and it was quite a race. 

But Barton was no longer 
young and his strength was just 
about to give out. He had 
reached the top of a hill and 
down in the valley below was 
his log cabin. It had never 
looker sweeter to him than it 
did now when it seemed that 
life was about to end. His 
pack of dogs caught sight of 
him and they came rushing tow-
ard him. And that gave Old 
Man Barton an idea. He turn-
ed around, facing the Indians, 
who were running toward him 
and of course could not see 
what was on the other side of 

Detection and Correction of Static 
and Dy-Namic Un-balance, Mis-Aline 

ment of Wheels and Bent Frames. 
This removes the principal 
reasons for excessive tire wear. 

Bring Your Prescriptions 
to Us for . • • 

FEWER REPAIR BILLS... 

16Et  	
Speed you can sec. Bring 1/2-
inch of water to a boil. Add 
vegetables and cover.Time re-
quired—two to three min-
utes! Turn burner to simmer 
speed which completes cook-
ing. With a single oven range, only if it is gas can you bake 

and broil at the same time. You can bake rolls, potatoes 
and a casserole dish while you broil meat in the separate 
broiler. 

"Claims" of speed don't mean a thing. But seeing is 
believing. Here you see why gas is fastest and most effi-
dent—why 96 out of 100 women in this area cook with 
gas. 

If your range has seen its best days, now is a good time 
to get a modern gas range. They cost less. They operate 
for less than 1/4  the cost of non-flame ranges. Gas burners 
last a lifetime; don't burn out. No special, expensive 
utensils are needed. No costly installation charge is added 
to the purchase price. Buy a modern gas range. 

Dependable 
Prescription 

Service Checking and Correction of Exces-
sive Car Vibration and Looseness of 
Parts—two of the most common 
reasons for high repair bills—which 
saves you money, increases driving 
pleasure and safety. 

Our Bear machne operator will give 
you prompt and efficient service. A. H. 
JUNGMAN is our licensed operator. 

• Reputable Manufacturers 
• Large Stock of Drugs 
• 24-Hour Service 
• Reasonable Prices 

Munday Truck & 
Tractor CO. 

Your Chrysler-Plymouth Dealer 

	ill IC .7%.111101700/CE = 

Warm up a gas burner? You 
don't have to! The second it's 
on, it's at maximum heat. No 
other range can be fast as 
gas. Or as efficient. The flame 
gives tailored heat—fits itself 
to any size or shape pan. Less 
waste heat. 

On display and sale almost ovorywhere 

SaVQ With Sqety -fit 

THDREXALL STORE 
THE:MOST COMPLETE DRUG STORE IN KNOX .COUNTY 

PHONE 78 MUNDAY, TEXAS 
Modern Gas Range 

a LONE STAR GAS COMPANY 

• 



Sorosis Club Of 
Benjamin Meets 
Last Thursday 

The Benjamin Sorosis Club 
met Thursday, November 16th, 
for their regular monthly meet-
ing. Program for the day was 
on International Relations Pro-
gram. Guest speaker for the 
occasion was Prof. A. F. Ed-
wards, of Midwestern Universi-
ty, Wichita Falls. He was in-
troduced by Mrs. T. G. Gill; his 
subject w a s "Education in 
World Citizenship." Prof, Ed-
warsd told of his attending the 
recent U. N. meeting at Lake 
Success; and also of conversa-
tions with people in European 
country on their ideas of Ameri-
can people. The talk was very 
educational as well as enjoyable. 

The club president, Mrs. Her-
bert Sams, and First Vice-Presi-
dent, Mrs. T. G. Gill, had just 
returned from the State Federa-
tion meeting in Fort Worth, 
Tuesday, Wednesday and Thurs-
day morning; driving in a short 
time before the club meeting 
began, but for lack of time did 
not give a full report of the 
State meeting. 

The hostesses, Mrs. 0. D. 
Propps and Mrs. A. H. Sams, 
served pumpkin pie and coffee 
to the following: 

Mmes. Grady Hudson, Howard 
Spikes, R. D. Benson, Wade 
House, W. F, Snody, and R. S. 
Brannon, and club members 
Mmes.Herbert Sams, T. G. Gill, 
Lee Snailum, L. A. Parker, 0. 
D. Propps, Ada Moorhouse, Allie 
Moorhouse, 0. W. Driver, J. W. 
Melton, L. C. Melton, A. H. 
Sams, Sr., C. H. Burnett, I. T. 
Wright, G. E. Rodgers, S. E. 
Reed, Harold Freeman, F. E. 
Davidson, Ernest Allen, M. D. 
McGaughey, J. A. Kilgore, W. A. 
Disheroon and J. C. Patterson. 

Featuring a Special 
Thanksgiving Dinner! 

TURKEY and DRESSING with GIBLET GRAVY 

VIRGINIA BAKED HAM with FRUIT SAUCE 

FRESH OCEAN CATFISH with TARTAR SAUCE 
and SLICED LEMON 

DESSERT 	 VEGETABLES  

PUMPKIN PIE, topped with 
WHIPPED CREAM, or 

MINCEMEAT PIE 

BAKED POTATO or 
CANDIED YAMS 

SUGARED CREAMED 
BUTTERED PEAS 

BAKED APPLE 
Salad: 

STUFFED CELERY 

COFFEE, TEA or MILK 

THANK YOU—CALL AGAIN! It's been a pleasure to 
serve you. 

Al's Coffee Shop 

MCI A PASIEl:I/ED 

HOMOGENIZED 
VfTAMIN D 

MILK 

For Those WINTER ILLS . 

Depend On 

Our 

Prescription 

Service! 

Winter is the period when you should 
guard against ill health. Many ills, 
some as a result of the common cold, are 
prevalent during this period. 

PROMPT, EFFICIENT SERVICE 

You can depend upon our prescription 
department to fill your doctor's pre- 
scription with promptness and efficien- 
cy. We maintain a stock of pure, fresh 
drugs for a n y emergency that might 
arise. Let us serve you. 

EILAND'S 
DRUG STORE 

ay Away These 
r Christmas 

• G. K ELECTRIC BLANKET 

• SUNBEAM MIXMASTERS 

• DOLLY MADISON CREAM FREEZER 

• FIRESTONE RADIO 

• ZENITH and EMERSON Console 

Radios 

• DEARBORN Gas Heaters 

• New, Beautiful Table Lamps 

• PERFECTION Oil Heaters 

• Silverware---Stainless Steel 

• REVERE Ware 

Reid's Hardware 
MUNDAY, TEXAS 

1 

'or 

a me 
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43110 Glory's New Home at Volley Forge BENJAMIN NEWS 
( Elda Purl Laird, Reporter) 

The Community Singing, 
which is held each second and 
fourth Sunday at Benjamin 
will be held in the Baptist 
Church, Sunday, November 26, 
beginning at 2:30 p. m. All who 
are interested in singing, or en-
joy listening to same, have a 
cordial invitation to attend. 

teg 
Caroline Polster were shoppers 
In Knox City Saturday. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. P. Porter, Sr., 
of Seymour, visited in the home 
of Mrs. W. A. Barnett and fam-
ily Sunday. 

Bill Townsend, of Portales, 
New Mexico, visited in the home 
of Miss Elda Purl Laird and 
family Sunday. 

Charles Ray Snailum, of San 
Angelo visited his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lee Snailum during 
the week end. 

Badge Steedman, of Sadler, 
visited John Isbon and other 
friends during the week end. 

• County Council 
Meets In Regular 
Session Nov. 17th 

it 

The Rexall 
STORE 

The Knox County Home Dem-
onstration Council met in regu-
lar session on Friday, Novem-
ber 17, in the assembly room of 
the county court house at Ben-
jamin. Nine members were pres-
apt, representing five clubs of 
the county. 

Each club held its Achieve-
ment Day, which had the aspect 
of being small county fairs. A 
vastaray of things were report 
ed to be displayed, such as: 
home-made soap, kitchen cur-
tains lamps and shades, cera-
mics, hand-painted china, cut 
work table cloths, knitted ski 
sox, water and oil painted pic-
tures, aprons a n d crocheted 
pieces. 

A neighboring club is invited 
to these achievement events, 
which affords members an op-
portunity to get new ideas for 
home making. 

The report on the number X-
rayed by the mobile T. B. unit 
was 1072. 

Clubs were urged to have 
ready the small gifts to send 
to the state hospitals by Decem-
ber 10. Each parcel should be 
marked as to size, contents and 
whether for male or female. 

Plans are being made to 
bring a Singer representative to 
Benjamin on Tuesday, Decem-
ber 12, to demonstrate the mak-
ing of belts, button holes, but-
tons, zippered openings, etc. 
Some sewing needs will be for 
sale, and the public is invited. 

Refreshments were served by 
Mrs. Arnold Navratil and Mrs. 
Alton Cook of Gillllanl. 

n 

Mrs. Minnie Wampler and Miss 
Sharon Harrison, daughter of 
Mrs. Opal Harrison, returned 
home Saturday after a weelc 
visit in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Troy Wampler and chil-
dren, of Dublin. 

Mrs. P. W. Laird and Miss El-
da Purl Laird were shoppers in 
Mundayand Knox City Saturday 
of last week. 

Mrs. Wynelle Porter was in 
Munday and Knox City of last 
week shopping and on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Allen 
spent the week end visiting with 
relatives and friends in DeLeon. 
Mr. D. M. Mathison, brother of 
Mrs. Allen, returned home with 
the Aliens for a visit. 

Mrs. W. A. Polster and Miss 

tiouschEE p liv 	qy 
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I will admit that during our 
courting days the last thing that 
crossed my mind was the fact that 
after a certain ceremony I'd he 
responsible for those white shirts 
that came calling for me. Of course 
Jeff was behind the shirts and at 
the moment that was about all I 
noticed. But long about the time 
our "I do" date was set it occurred 
to me that Jeff was the spic 'n' 
spannest man I knew. It also 
dawned on me that mother wasn't 
going to be around to take care of 
my lovely trousseau things. In 
short, the new -Mrs. Stuart was go- 

ing to be faced 
with a laundry 
problem. Simul-
taneously I dis-
covered that 
about the most 
non-elastic arti-
cle known is a 
newlywed bud-
get. And there 
had been no pro-

vision in said budget for a washing 
machine. 

Then and there began the most 
intensive campaign poor Jeff has 
been through to date and I pass on 
that strategy for what it's worth. 
I asked for an inventory of his 
washable wardrobe, itemized every 
tubbable article I owned, compiled 
a list of our necessary linens, tow-
els, blankets, etc. The list stag-
gered even me. I appealed to his 
American love of mechanization; I 
pointed out that a mechanical 
washer was sanitary, safe, and as 
easy to operate as the mere flick of 
a switch. With the budget bugaboo 
in mind I noted carefully that a 
home washing machine helped 
spare the life of clothing. I even 
brought interior decorating into 
the scene by pointing out that a 
machine was a wonderful item in 
tinting sheets or spreads or drapes. 
Then there was the possibility of 
baby clothes later on that would 
have to be clean and sweet-smell-
ing. I wound up the campaign in a 
burst of oratory which labeled the 
washing machine as vitally essen-
tial to the morale and health of 
the American home. 

Jeff couldn't help himself: he 
gave in and came through _with a 
washing machine that is the pride 
of our household. The best part of 
the situation is that I came to 
realize that every sales point was 
true. And while I'm glad I talked 
Jeff into it, I'm even more delighted 
to find out how right I was! 

'The first American flag to fly over the nation's new super-road 
was raised by these seven former fighting men in a stirring ceremony 
marking the public opening of the eastern extension of the 267-mile 
Pennsylvania Turnpike. Now serving American motorists at the Gulf 
stations on the Turnpike, the men, (from left to right) Robert E. 
Walters, Allentown, Pa.; J. J. Fisher, Pittsburgh; Ed Walker, Wash-
ington, D.C.; Sayles Steere, Philadelphia; T. W. McKee, Blairsville. 
Pa.; Jack Ward, Cynwyd, Pa.; and John Rinehart, Pittsburgh; will 
conduct the flag raising and lowering every day at this new site over-
looking beautiful and historic Valley Forge. 

Methodist Home 	Activities Of The Observes Birthday 
Colored People 

Mrs. Emma Parker of For 
Worth was a guest in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. D. D. Clough 
recently. 

Mrs. David Penick of Rule 
visited friends and relatives here 
this week. 

Wynelle Fitzgerald of Fort 
Worth visited his father, Cecil 
Fitzgerald, here over the week 
end. 

Dorcas Class 
Entertains T. E. L. 
Class Thursday 

An interesting time was ha,  
at the school last Thursday 
night. The cake was won by 
Mrs. Elnora Hendrix. We wish 
to thank Mrs. Allene Johnson 
for donating the cake and our 
many friends for their coopera 
tion. Receipts for the evenint; 
were $8.15. 

Cakes and pies were brought 
by the following: Mrs. Dollie 
Jones, Ruby Durham and Ber-
nice Webber. These were sold 
with coffee. 

A box supper is being spon 
sored by the upper elementary 
grades Tuesday night, Nathaniel 
Jones in charge. 

Miss Yvonne Morris of With!. 
ta Falls is visiting in the home 
of her parents, Mr. and Mrs. H 
H. Morris, this week. 

Mrs. 0. W. Lee is visiting in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Sid-
ney Lee in Fort Werth this 
week. 

WACO—The Methodist Home 
for Orphans celebrated its 60th 
birthday November8 with an all-
day program, attended by four 
Methodist bishops and hundreds 
of visitors. 

The high point of the day was 
the dedication of the Harry Mer-
edith and Tom Mitchell Homes, 
each costing approximately 
$125,000. One was presented by 
Mr. and Mrs. H. W. Meredith of 
Mineola; the other, by Mr. and 
Mrs. T. C. Mitchell of Marfa in 
memory of their son, John 
Smith Mitchell. 

Bishop William C. Martin of 
Dallas, presided at the dedica-
tion. Retired Bishops H. A. 
Boaz and Charles C. Selecman, 
both of Dallas, participated in 
the program. The sermon was 
delivered by Bishop A. Frank 
Smith of Houston. 
In the morning the cornerstone 

of the 50-year-old main building 
was removed in preparation for 
replacing it with a modern ad-
ministration unit given by 
friends of the children. At noon 
a barbecue was spread by Supt. 
Hubert Johnson and the staff. 

Bishop Smith praised those 
who have provided the buildings 
and some $3,000,000 endowment 
for the home of about 425 chil-
dren. It was announced that 
Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Youngblood 
of Waco have donated a large 

Mrs. M. L. Barnard visited rle-
atives in Wichita Falls last Sun-
day. 

Members of the Dorcas Sun-
day School Class of the First 
Baptist Church entertained the 
T. E. L. class on Thursday, Oc-
tober 16, at three o'clock at the 
church. The meeting was open-
ed with prayer by Mrs. A. U. 
Hathaway. 

Mrs. J. D. McClaran, president 
of the Dorcas class, had charge 
of the program, Mrs. Huron A. 
Polnac at the organ. Each 
guest asked for her favorite 
song to be sung, and several 
musical numbers were played. 

This was the first time that 
some of the T. E. L. members 
came to the new church. Every-
one was pleased that it was 
made possible for them to meet 
with the Dorcas members. 

Refreshments of coffee and 
cakes were served to eight 
guests and 14 members. Host-
esses were Mrs. L. B. Patter-
son, Sr., Mrs. J. D. McClaran, 
Mrs. F. A. Reid and Mrs. W. 0. 
Mays. 

endowment fund. 
Also that morning, the 100-

member Texas Methodist Plan-
ning Commission was in its 
third annual session with Dr. R. 
F. Curl of San Antonio, presid-
ing. Officers for 1950-51 elected 
at that time were: president, 
Pat Thompson, Bay City; vice-
president, Rev. Dr. Umphrey 
Lee, Dallas (SMU president ); 
secretary, Rev. Marvin Boyd. 
Plainview. 

Drive carefully—the life you 
save may be your own! 

Visit Us for Needs for . . . 

The Home 
See our stock of home appliances and 

other needs before you buy. All a r e 
quality items, and priced right. We now 
have a stock of .... 

ritestone 

A small deposit will hold any of t h e above 

items until Christmas, 

Blacklock Home 
Auto Supply 
"Your FIRESTONE Dealer" 

Munday, Texas Phone 53 

'firestorm 



1080, Friday, 9:15 p. in. Pray-
ers). 

The 	radio program o v e r 
KRLD, Dallas, is less than a 
month old, and consists only of 
prayers for peace. Non-Catho-
lics are also requested to join 
this 15-minute program of pray-
er for peace. 

Rev. Fabian Diersing, 0. S. B. 
Pastor. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Munday, Texas 

Huron A. Polnac, pastor 
Sunday School 	 10:00 A. M.  
Morning Worship 	 11:00 A. M. 
Training Union 	 6:-30 P. M. 
Evening Worship 	 7:30 P. M. 

CORER BAPTIST CHURCH 
S. E. Stevenson, Pastor 

10 a. m., Sunday School. 
11 a. m., preaching, "Nehern 

iah's Revival." 
6:30 p. m., Training Union, 
7:30 p. m., preaching, "Spirit-

ual Spoilers."--Col. 2:8. 

CHURCH OF GOD 
SERVICES 

Sunday School, 10:00 a. m.; 
Evangelistic services, 7:30 p. m.; 
Prayer meeting, Wednesday, 
7:30 p. m. 

Special healing service, Fri-
day, 7:30 p. m. Come with the 
sick for healing. Y. P. E., Satur-
day, 7:30 p. m. 

The public is welcome. Spec-
ial singing and music at each 
service. 

Rev. I. C. Hull, pastor. 

NOTICE 
There will be no services at 

the Presbyterian Church on Sun 
day, November 26. 

Gary Coopereportrays a 
fighting deputy marshall in 
"Dallas," Warner Bros.' 
Technicolor drama of the 
West, in which Ruth Roman, 
Steve Cochran co-star. 

This shop is completely 
equipped for every phase of 
Engine Cooling from replac-
ing a thermostat to recoring 
the radiator and flushing the 
engine block Specialist ser-
vice assures dependable re-
sults, promptly 

ATTENTION, COTTON and 
GRAIN FARMERS! 

We have a few "RANGER" fifth-wheel farm wagons, with 
or without springs, durable in construction, extremely eco-
nomical, low in price because of their outstanding features 
and long life. 

The fifth wheel reduces turning radius. Electric weld-
ing, standard Temkin bearings, standard Alemite fittings. 
cold rolled spindles. Wheels are standard 15 inch. Nice 
finish and good appearance. 

These wagons will bring to their owners a pride in their 
dependable performance. Heavy duty V-hitch, which is 
guaranteed not to whip. 

"With the Ranger heavy load wagons, just keep rolling 
-along." 

We can also furnish you with 3, 4, and 5-row pick-up 
type stalk cutters, 2 and 4-row all-steel pickup godevils, 7-
row pickup Ford sand fighters, and 9-row drag type fight- 
ers. 

Tandem type stock trailers in all-steel frame work with 
oak flooring and finished oak sideboards. 

Stock feeders, all-steel branding chutes. 

On account of scarcity of materials, and the very rapid 
price increases, my advice is buy your future needs now. 
Remember, my price is right, and you can save $$$$ here. 

Engineers, draftsmen, fabricators, scientfic blacksmith-
ing, portable welding machines, day or night service. 

0. V. Milstead Welding and 
Blacksmith Shop 

Back of Yarbrough Hotel 	 Phone 293 
W. A. (BILL) WILLIAMS and LUTHER JOHNSON 

"INntrinri g 

We can supply your needs in farm 
equipment. Come in and see the follow- 
ing: 

• MOLDBOARD PLOWS 

• CHISEL PLOWS 

• EDGERS 

• ROTARY STALK CUTTERS 
(This stalkcutter will shred the 
stalks and destroy the home of 
the insects.) 

• LISTER SHARES 

Reid's Hardware 
Alunday, Texas 
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Goree News Items Services At 
Area Churches Mrs. T. H. Jones was taken to 

the Wichita Falls Clinic Hospit-
al last Monday for treatment. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tlamadge Falls 
of Throckmorton spent last Sun-
day in the home of Mr. and Mrs 

..„1/. D. Stalcup. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
J. B. Barnett, Evangelist 

Bible School 	 10:00 a. in. 
Preaching 	 10:50 a. in. 
Communion 	 11:45 a. in. 
Evening Bible classes, 6:30 p. m. 
Evening worship ser- 

vices 	 7:15 p. m. 
Wednesday evening Bible 

classes 	 7:30 p. rn. 
Sermon subject Sunday morn. 

ing : 
"The Church—Its Teaching 

Function." 
Sermon subject Sunday even 

fug: 
"Our Responsibility to Youth" 
Hear the Munday Church of 

Christ radio program every Sat-
urday morning at 11:15 over 
KSEY Seymour 1230 k. c. 

Welcome to all our services. 

noon. 
Philip Jones is spending a 

few days with his mother, Mrs. 
E. J. Jones, after being dismiss-
ed from an Abilene hospital 
where she received treatment 
for some two months. 

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Tony Hammons the 
past week were an aunt, Mrs. Le-
land Broughton of DeLeon, and 
an uncle, Bob Elder and son and 
Mrs. Harry Hayes of Milnesand, 
New Mexico. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Goode and 
Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Blankinship 
left the first of this week on a 
deer hunting trip to South Tex-
as. 

Mrs . Louis Blankinship and 
children have joined Louis in 
Fort Smith, Ark., where he is 
stationed at Camp Chappey in 
the hospital division. 

George Crouch, Jr., of Brooks 
Field, San Antonio, spent the 
week end with relatives in Go-
ree and Seymour. George was 
a clerk in the Goree post office, 
and was recently called back in 
to service. He spent several 
years in service during World 
War II. 

BETHLEHEM PRIMITIVE 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Elder Raymond Bunch, Pastor 
5 Miles Northwest of Munday 

Services at 11 a. m. Saturday 
before the second Sunday. Ser-
vices at 10:30 a. m. Sunday. 

Elder L M. Handley preaches 
the third Sunday. Services at 
10:30 a. in. Sunday. Singing in 
the evening. 

WEINERT FOUR-SQUARE 
CHURCH 

Waned, Texas 
Wm. 0. Pritchet, Pastor 

Sunday School ____ 10:00 P .M. 
Morning Worship _ 11:00 P. M. 
Youth Services ____ 6:00 0P. 35... 
Evangelistic Service, 7:00 P. M. 
Prayer Meeting, 

Wedrisday 	 7:00 P. M. 
Preaching Service, 

Saturday 	 7:00 P. M 
Radio Broadcast, Satur-

days_______ 9:00-9:30 A. M. 
KDWT, Stamford 

FIRST METHODIST CHURCH 
R. L. Butler, Pastor 

Church school 	10 a. m. 
Morning worship __ 10:55 a. m. 
W. S. C. S. Mondays____4 p. m. 
M. Y. F. Sunday 	 6 p. rn, 
Vesper Service 	 6:30 p. 

Services are being held in the 
school auditorium while our 
new church is being constructed. 

U. S. milk production reaches its peak in June. An industry 
goal is to make this curve more even through the year 

Texas Milk Industry Leader 
TEXAS' MILK INDUSTRY is a tremendous factor in the health 

and economic progress of the state, according to new figures 
developed by the Milk Industry Foundation. 

The ndustry's impo 	to the 	is 	illustrated by Texas'
i 
 1,155,000 milk cowsrtance which were

State 
 valu

g
ed
raphically  

at $180,144,000 in 
1949. These cows produced 1,757,000,000 quarts of milk during the year. 

income 
Tex

from mi
as dairy 

 lk i n 
farmers received se a total of $117 

5
,669,000 in cash 

1949. Chee production of ,660,000 pounds 
and butter 15,125,000 pounds, and ice cream 23,760,000 gallons plus 
other dairy products swell the tremendous total which the milk 
industry adds to the State's wealth. 

ply, sanitation, pasteurization and 
distribution is bringing dairymen 
here to study it from throughout 
the world. The United States is 
now the greatest dairy nation. 

Nearly 23 million cows on three 
quarters of the Nation's 5,859,000 
farms produce the 55,000,000,000 
quarts of milk a year which would 
fill a river 3,000 miles long, 40 
feet wide and 3 feet deep. In 
quarts side by side a year's milk 
supply would go almost 140 times 
around the earth.One out of every 
15 U. S. families is said to be de-
pendent on milk for a livelihccd. 

Milk farm cash income is le.rgrt 
than hogs; almost twice wheat; 
nearly one and a half times poul-
try and egg's; more than one and 
one-half times cotton; four times 
tobacco. 

Just Arrived! 

Mr. and Mrs. Merle Pearson 
And little son left Monday for 

their home in Portland, Oregon, 
after spending two weeks visit-
ing her parents, Rev. and Mrs. 
S. E. Stevenson of Goree, and 

*Sher relatives in Munday and 
Abilene. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leo E. Jones 
and daughter, Anne, of Sweet-
water spent Sunday with rela-
tives in Goree and Munday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ross Madole and 
children of Littlefield visited 
Mr. 	Madole's mother, M r s 
Laura M. Madole, and other rel-
atives here during the week end. 

Mrs. Lessie Jackson is spend-
ing a few days with her chil-
dren in Wichita Falls and Iowa 
Park. 

Mrs. Henry Coffman of Fort 
Worth and Mrs., Homan McMa-
hon spent several days the past 
week visiting Mr. and Mrs. Neal-
le Moore in McCamey. They 
also visited relatives in Odessa. 

Mr. and Mrs. Terrell Boggs 
attended the funeral of a sister-
in-latV, Mrs. Freeman Smith ,in 
Knox City last Monday after- 

• 0. L. Wall and son of Green- 
ville visited Mr. and Mrs. J. A. 
Bilbrey and other relatives here 
last week end. 

Joyce Dean Weir of Midwest-
ern College, Wichita Falls, spent 
the week end with her parents. 

Howard Stasey of Lovington, 
New Mexico, was a business vis-
itor here the first of this week. 

Fresh Shipment PANGBURN'S 

Few industries have shown 
more progress in the last quarter 
century than milk. I lilk consump-
tion is on a higher level. From 
the long process of raising better 
calves and growing improved 
feeds to the use of mechanical 
milking, more rapid transport to 
the plant, new testing methods, 
pasteurizing and bottling, out-
standing advances have been 
made. 

Milk and its products com-
prise around one-fourth of the 
foods consumed annually by the 
average American and 60,000,000 
quarts of fresh milk and cream a 
day are distributed to consumers 
through % ores and home deliver-
ies. 

Milk in this country today is the 
best in the world, the Foundation 
says, and the U. S. system of sup- 

Better Candies 
COMING SOON TO ROXY 

••-•••••• r 	 ITM,Y77rArr."A‘rr"‘"-:"' 

In one-half pound to 3-pound boxes. 

ASSORTED DARK and 
LIGHT CHOCOLATES 

The REXALL Store 
MUNDAY, TEXAS 

CARD OF THANKS 

With hearts full of gratitude, 
we attempt to express our 
thanks to our many friends for 
the kind words, telegrams and 
lovely flowers which came our 
way in the tragic death of our 
loved one, Dr. Bruce Johnson. 
Everything you did is deeply ap-
preciated, and we pray God's 
richest blessings on you all. 

Mrs. Bruce Johnson a n 
Charles Bruce. 

The R. H. Morirs family. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Reeves and 
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Reeves 
were in Dallas two days last 
week, visiting with relatives and 
attending to business matters. 

Panola County County 
Farmer Ili `Wen 

"Ag" Award 
ST. JOSEPH'S CHURCH 

(Catholic) Rhineland 
Holy Masses: Sundays and 

Holydays, 7:00 and 9:00 a. m. 
"Hour of Faith", KFDX 990 

Sundays, 10:30 a. m. 
"Rosary for Peace" KRLD. 

4 

Mr. and Mrs. George Spann of 
Dallas and Mrs. Erna Mae Lee 
of Wichita Falls visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
Spann over the week end. 

0- 

Miss Charlotte Williams); who 
is attending T. S. C. W. in Den-
ton, came in this week to spend 
the holidays with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. P. V. Williams. 

vel
Ris  
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1-Plow Pony-62-cubic-inch, 4-cylinder 
engine, 3 speeds forward. 

Wilson Radiator 
Service 

U. W. WILSON, Owner 

Just North of Ford Tractor 
Agency 

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Mont-
gomery and Mrs. D. D. Clough 
visited relatives and friends in 
Dallas over the week end. 

Mrs. Bill Ehlers and children 
left this week for Midland to 
visit Mrs. Ehler's parents, Mr. 
and MrS. Charles Styron, for 
some two weeks..  

Miss Opal Booe spent the 
week end visiting in the home 
of her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Les-
lie Melton, in Weatherford. 

Miss Frances Nance of Abi-
lene spent Sunday in the home 
ofher parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Nance. 

Mrs. Fred N. Warren of Lub-
bock visited with relatives here 
the first part of the week. 

CHICAGO—H. Byron Rhea o 
Panola County, Texas, received 
the coveted W. G. Skell agricut-
tuarl achivement award on Sat-
urday, November 18. 

The Rhea farm consists of 50 
acres—it is one of those "little 
but oh, my!" establishments. 
Agriculturally, these 50 acres 
are most important as a model 
demonstration farm. Mr. Rhea's 
farm is principally pasture, 
beef cattle being his main 
source of income. However. 
other crops are raised. T w n 
acres in corn runs from 60 to 
100 bushels per acre, and 2% 
acres in truck crops. 

Mr. Rhea and his wife, Ivie. 
are both active in community 
work, giving unselfishly o 
their time and efforts to hell 
build a better community. 

Saturday morning, his neig!-
bors and friends gathered at a 
big community breakfast to wit-
ness the presentation of the 
award, which consists of a $100 
U. S. Savings Bond, gold lapel 
pin and a handsome scroll. A 
personal representative of W. G. 
Skelly, president of the Skelly 

Oil Company, was on hand to 
make the presentation. 

Iikiiimmoimmastea  

2-Plow "22"-140-cubic-inch, 
4-cylinder engine, 4 speeds forward. 

Quality Items for e • • 

The Farm 
24-Plow "30"-162-cublc-inch, 

4-cylinder engine, 5 speeds forward. 

* It's out in the field, on your own faun, 
that you discover the real power in a 

Massey-Harris. Out in the field doing your 
regular work . . . watching it lick the tough 
spots only you know . . . feeling the quick 
response of a lively engine that's ready to dig 
in from the word "go." 

That's the big test. The test a Massey-Harris 
likes. The test that will convince you there's 
more power in Massey-Harris high compres-
sion engines ... more power-saving economy 
in Massey-Harris straight-line transmission 
design. It's out in the field where you learn 
about economy too. The real dollars and 
cents kind that lets you do more work on less 
fuel. Economy is built right into a Massey-
Harris. Better design in the engine, the trans-
mission and distribution of weight let you 
cover more acres at less cost. 

But try it for yourself. Get on a Massey-
Harris. Drive it. Discover a new thrill in better 
tractor performance. 3-4-Plow " 44"-260-cublc.inch. 

4-cylinder engine, 5 speeds forward- 

4-5-Plow "55"-382-cubic-inch, 
4-cylinder engine, 4 speeds, forward. 	 4-cylinder engine. 5 ;Poet's forward. 

3-44Iow "44" Diesel-260-cubic inch; 

SHARP MOTOR & EQUIPMENT CO. 
ON SEYMOUR HIGHWAY 

Your MASSEY-HARRIS Dealer 

Phone 248-J 

e.....trtiCrrr,reit't-ii.re.W.  •  ••••• 
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lion members, 
In addition to her cotton dut-

ies, she will take time out for 
typical tourist sight-seeing to 
the celebrated points of interest 
in each of the Latin-American 
nations. She will visit such 
scenes as Havan's Moro Castle, 
Rio's breath-taking Copacabana 
Beach and Sugar Loaf Moun-
tain, the historic Lima Cathed- vitaL 
ral nad Plaza de Armas, and 
other famous landmarks. 

After her South American 
tour, the Maid of Cotton will 
board her Braniff El Conquista- 	4. 
dor for the return flight to the 4ie  
United States and the conclus-. 
ion of her six-month interna- 
tional tour. 

Six Latin American Nations Are 
Added To Maid Of Cotton's Tour Used Tractors 

Buy, Sell, Rent, Lease or Exchange It Through . . . 

The Times Want Ads  and Equipment The 1951 Maid of Cotton will 
he flying down to Rio and other 
leading cities in six Latin Amer-
ican nations next June, the Na-
tional Cotton Council has reveal-
ed 

For the first time in the his-
tory of the Maid of Cotton tour, 
King Cotton's fashion and good-
will ambassadress will carry 
greetings to the southern hemis-
phere. Countries to be included 
on her Latin American journey 
are Cuba, Panama, Peru, Brazil, 
Argentina, and Uruguay. 

The Maid will spend three 
weeks with the U. S. cotton in-
dustry's Latin American amig-
os. She will cover more than 
14,000 miles on this phase of her 
tour. Already 50,000 miles of 
travel have been scheduled for 
the 1951 Maid on her cross-coun-
try flight to more than 30 U. S. 
cities and her trans-Atlantic 
flight to England and France. 

The Maid will embark from 
Houston, Texas. Throughout her 
three-week Latin-American trip, 
she will travel in air-condition-
ed, sound-proofed luxury at 300 
miles an hour aboard an "El 
Conquistador," Braniff Airways 
DC-6 airliner. 

Three and one-half hours af-
ter boarding her El Conquista-
dor at Houston, the Maid will 
land at Havana, Cuba. From 
Cuba the cotton emissary will 
go to Balboa, Panama, on an 
overnight air sleeper flight. Af-
ter a brief visit there, she will 
take off again for Lima/ Peru, 
famed "City of Kings", high in 
the Andes mountains. From 
Linn the Maid will fly non-stop 
across the entire continent of 

ZIPPER— Notebooks now in 
stuck at The Munday Times. 

12-tic. 

innerspring Mattresses - 
We are now aole to fill all 
orders for innerspring mat-
tresses. There's none better at 
any price. Also plenty of tick-
ing in stock for any kind of 
mattress you need. Home Fur-
niture Co. and Matress Factory 

2-tic, 

rudential 

FAR M 

South America to the famed 
city of Rio de Janeiro, Brazil. 
Later she will visit another Bra-
bilian metropolis, Sao Paulo, 
center of the country's cotton 
industry. 

Argentina is the Maid's next 
stop and there she will pay King 
Cotton's respects to picturesque 
Buenos Aires, often called the 
"Paris of the Americas." Last un 
her Latin-American itinerary is 
a visit to the beautiful city of 
Montevideo, capital of the re-
public of Uruguay. 

In each country the Maid of 
Cotton will deliver gratings to 
state and civic dignitigiles. She 
will wear her all-cotton ward-
robe of glamorous cotton fash-
ions, created by 30 of the United 
States' outstanding designers, 
to show the newsest cotton fab-
rics and trends of the 1951 sea-
son. Wherever she goes, the 
Maid will be in the spotlight as 
the official ambassadress of the 
U. S. cotton industry's 12 mil- 

1..,,x.1LOANS 
SCRATCH PADS—Bound anti 

perforated. Ideal for figuring 
Ten cents each. The Munday 
Times. 	 30-tf4 

WANTED — Clean cotton rags. 
No khaki or silk. Will pay 121/2  
cents per pound. Munday 
Truck and Tractor Co. 40tic. 

Model "Z" M.M tracto 
with 2-row equipment. 

Model J M-M tractor wits 
2-row equipment. Late model. 

F-12 Farmall with 2-row 
equipment 

1 regular Farmall with 2-
row equipment. 

One 2-bottom 14 inch Inter-
national moldboard plow. 

F-20 Farmall with 2-row 
equipment. 

Model B John Deere tract 
or with 2-row equipment. 

New and Used FORD Trac-
tors. 

1946 Minneapolis •M oline 
"R" tractor with 2-rosy equip-
ment 

One 3-bottom Internationa 
moldboard plow. 

Single bottom 16-inch Inter-
national breaking plow. 

	FOR 

Polio Insurance 
SEE J. C. HARPHAM 

Insurance, Loan, Real Estate 

Any girl born in a cotton-pro- 2 
ducing state, between the ages 
of 19 and 25, who has never 
been married and is at least 5 
feet 5 inches tall is eligible for 
the Maid of Cotton contest. En-
try blanks and information may 
be obtained from the National 
Coton Council, Box 18,) Mem-
phis, Tenn. Completed applica-
tions must be postmarked not 
later than midnight December 
1st. 

1VOID DANGER—That results 
from impioper wheel alignment 
and poor brakes. We can flit 
your car with our new Bear 
machine. Munday Truck & 
Tractor Co. 	 5-tfc 

Low Interest 

j Long Term 

I Fair Appraisal 

Prompt Service KRAUSE PLOWS—We can make 
immediate delivery on 8, 10, 12,, 
and 15 foot Krause plows. Muni 
day Truck & Tractor Co. 32-tfc. FOR — 

I C. Harpham Polio Insurance 
SEE J. C. HARPHAM 

Insurance, Loans, Real Estate It Pays To Advertise 

RADIO REPAIRS—Bring us 
your radios for repairs. We 
repair any make or model, 
giving you prompt service. 
Strickland's Radio Service. 

16-tfe 

Insurance, Real Estate 
And Loans 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 

Authorized Mortgage Loan So- 
licitor For The Prudential In- 
surance Company of America. 

WANTED — Clean cotton rags. 
No khaki or silk. Will pay 121,6 
cents per pound. Munday 
Truck and Tractor Co. 40-tic. 

HAMLIN SAND & GRAVEL CO., Inc. 
Route 4, Hamlin, Texas 

Call on us for your building material needs, quality ma-
terials, passing Architect and State Highway Specifications. 
Washed and graded concrete sand, concrete gravel, roofing 
gravel, filter rock, shooting gravel. All materials carefully 
washed, screened and graded to specifications. Rail deify 
ery or by 12 Yard trucks. Prompt and courteous attention 
will be given to all inquiries. 

J. L. Stodghill 
ADDING MACHINE. — Paper 

Good stock now on hand at The 
Times Office. 	 20-tfc 

LUZIER'S 
Individualized Cosmetics, recom-
mended by the Medical Associa-
tion. Your Luzier representa 
lives: Mrs. J. C. McGee, Knox 
City; Mrs. Bill Gaither, Munday; 
Frances Jameson, Goree, all 
working this territory. 	51-tic 

Miliitraivr 	' 
FORD TRACTOR DEALER 

INNERSPRING MATTRESSES—
We are now able to fill all 
orders for innerspring mat 
tresses. There's none better al 
any price. Also plenty of tick 
ing in stock for any kind 
mattress you need. Home Fur 
niture Co. & Mattress Factory 

2-11c 

NEED TO REPLACE 

AUTO GLASS? FOR RENT—Furnished apart 
ments with private baths. See 
D. E. Holder at Holder's Gro- 
cery. 	 14-tic 

PHONES: 1094-M Stamford 
9008-F2 Hamlin 
21688 Abilene 

LET US—Give you wheel align 
ment service with our new Bear 
machine. Makes driving safer! 
Munday Truck & Tractor Co. 

5-tic John Hancock Farm 

FOR SALE—Two choice homes, 
close in and on pavement. 
Both houses 6 rooms and bath. 
J. C. Harpham Insurance 
Agency. 	 15-tic FOR SALE—Turkeys, see W. H. 

Hodges, Knox City. 	16-6tp 

Complete safety glass and auto 
body hardware replacement serv-
ice. Quick . economical Drive 
in today—for Pittsburgh Safety 
Glass% 

BLACKLOCH HOME AND 
AUTO SUPPLY 

KRAUSE PLOWS—We can mak6 
immediate delivery on 8, 10, 12 
and 15 foot Krause plows. Mun 
Truck & Tractor Co. 	32-tfe, 

MAKE SURE--You can steer sure 
enough. Get a Bear wheel align, 
ment check-up today. Munday 
Truck & Tractor Co. 	5-tic 

CURTIS CIRCULATION CO.--
Saturday Evening Post, Lad-
ies' Home Journal. 
Country Gentleman until No-
vember 30, 20 months for 
$1.00. Orville Tuttle, 509 Mun- 
clay Ave., Phone 83. 	15-3tp 

And Ranch Loans! 
• 4 Per Cent Interest 

• No Inspection Fees 

• Liberal Options 

nusene.....akur  

NEW 
14-Foot Massey-Harris 

SELF-PROPELLED 

Combines 
Available at 

SHARP MOTOR & EQUIP_ 4ENT 

COMPANY 

Combine Headquarters 	Phone 248-J 
—North on Highway 277 

J. C. Borden 
FOR SALE—Well fed turkeys. 

30 cents per pound for gob-
blers, 45 cents for hens, ' on 
foot. Lee Leflar farm, 4U 
miles northeast of Munday 

16-2tp 

FOR SALE 	Some good farm 
buildings to be moved. Owner 
will sacrifice in order to get 
them moved at once. See J 
B. (BIRL) JUSTICE, Goree, 
Texas. 	 15-2tp-tic 

NOTICE—Road gravel, $1.50 
per yard; gravel (Rule), $3.00 
per yard. Let me figure with 
you on fixing your street or 
driveway. Phone 362-J. A. E. 
(Sappy) Bowley. 	16-tic 

FOR 	RENT—Bedrooms. S e e 
Mrs. Letha Wilson. Phone 308- 
R. 	 tic 

NOTICE—Will do ironing at 
home, also house cleaning. 
See Mrs. Allen in upstairs 
apartment at Jim Strickland's 
1204 Main. Phone 30-R. 

17-2tp 

WANTED—Pastry baking and 
ironing done. See Mrs. Smith, 
Apartment 5, Lamsfords 
Apartments. 	 16-2tp 

;EPTIC TANK—Cleaning. Also 
pump out cess pools and storm 
cellars, and will clean cisterns 
and shallow wells. Average 
home. $20 to $35. Phone 381-M. 
Box 224, Seymour, Texas. J. H. 
Crawford. 	 23-tfe FOR SALE-1939 Dodge 2-door 

sedan. A good car, clean in-
side. See R. H. Lain at the 
Farmall House. 	 ltp 

FOR SALE—Baled oats in 
square bales. S e e Clifford 
Cluck, Munday. 	50-tfc 

FOR SALE—G o o d 
complete with tower. See Pete 
Beecher at Broach Equipment. 

ltp 

\'OW TN STOCK—Speednall sets 
Esterhrook fountain pens, Scrip-
t() pencils. Columbia arch files 
thumb tacks, paper punches 
tr See our line of office sup 

niies. The Munday Times. 
13-tfc 

SHIRT POCKET— Protractors 
and ladies' cuffettes now in 
stock. The Munday Times. 

12-tic. 

FOR SALE—One 8-foor electric 
Leonard refrigerator, slightly 
used. Has freezing unit across 
top, '50 model. Covered with 
guarantee, priced $200.00. Ce-
cil Gulley, Box 551, Munday. 

15.3tp 

Asitc: 

44-citti lye lest,  
torr Met Cyr?....411 1 

ELECTROLUX—Vacuum clean-
ers, $77.50. Free demonstra-
tion. Terms if desired. Place 
your orders for future deliv-
ery. W. H. McDonald, Sey-
our, Texas. Phone 223-W. 

50-tic 

COME IN—WE WILL 

TRY TO TRADE! 

-TO GULF—Try a tank of the 
"better than ever" Good Gulf 
Gasoline. Drive into our sta-
tion for all types of service, 
from washing and greasing, 
gas. oils. greases, r ato access-
ories; and, of cr arse, those 
good Gulf Tires. R. B. Bow-
den Gulf Service Station. 

41-tfc 

AFRAID  OF BURGLARS? 

ADDING MACHINE Paper naw 
in stock. 15 cents per roll. The 
Munday Times. 	43-tic. 

_J BEAR 
THE BANNER 
7  SAKTI'  

You never know when a burg-
lar will call. Before he does, 
call us for theft insurance. Waranal1111Marlial 

	FOR -- 

Polio Insurance 
SEE J. C. HARPHAM 

insurance, Loans, Real Estate 

PHONE 61 Munday Truck And 
Tractor Co. 

DR. J. E. O'HAIR 
Optometrist 

9ee Wore and earn etwa cad 
Siteed-O-Pliget Save/tar eel/edam 

STENCILS FOR YOUR—Merle Norman Cos-
metics, see Mrs. A. E. Rich-
mond at Richmond Jewelry 
Store, Munday, Texas. 

50-tfo 

COMPLETE 
VISUAL ANALYSIS 

Seymour Hotel Building 
SEYMOUR, TEXAS 

Hours 9-5:30 	Tel. 193 
In Crowell Every Thursday 

We Can Furnish the Following 

Buildimg Material: 

Users report that they get as high es 15,000 
copies regularly-copies an dear, dean and 
sharp. Remarkable body strength and uni-
form, flawless coating withstand these tong 
exacting runs. Unconditionally guaranteed. 

in sizes to fit any make duplicator. 

LETTER SIZE..... 	 $3.00 gam 

LEGAL SIZE 	$3.15 quint 

STENCILS— Letter else. $2.2.1 Lego 	an. $2.50 

One F-20 Farmall tractor 
with 2-row equipment. 

3 F-U Farmall tractors 
with 2-row equipment. 

Also a nice selection of 
used International and John 
Deere one-ways, in all sizes. 

1948 Chrysler Windsor club 
coupe. You'll have to see it 
to appreciate it. 

1947 Chrysler Windsor club 
coupe. A very clean car. 

1941 Dodge 4-door. Priced 
right. 

1940 Chevrolet club coupe, 
priced to sell. 

MUNDAY esif 1.14 et°  

ES. 	S, 
IHE FARMALL ROM 

Used Tractors 

and Machinery 

Used Cars and 

Trucks 

NEED PROPERTY?—When it 
need of farms, or city property 
in Goree, see J. B. Justice, 
Goree, Texas. 	 42-tic 

KRAUSE PLOWS—We can makE 
immediate delivery on 8, 10, 12, 
and 15 foot Krause plows. Mun• 
Truck & Tractor Co. 	32-tfc 

J. C. Borden Agency 
First National Bank Bldg., 

TEL. 126 
Munday, Texas 

	FOR 

Polio Insurance 
SEE J. C. HARPHAM 

Insurance, Loans, Real Estate 

IS YOUR HOME NEXT? 

STOP QUICK—A split seconit 
may make She difference be' 
tween life and death. Let us 
make your car safe with out 
new Bear System service. Man 
day Truck & Tractor Co. 5-tic 

FOR RENT—Three room un-
furnished apartment to elder-
ly or middle aged couple. See 
Mrs. W. F. McMahon. 15-tic 

Why, sure! It's just as important to have 
prtper headlights for safe driving as 
it is to ;lave good eyesight. More night 
accidents are caused by poor head-
lights than by any other single cause. 
The Bear Headlight 
Test takes only a 
few seconds ... why 
not have your car 
checked TODAYI 

Chrysler 
Plymouth 
Phone 61 

pima elietie 
LET'S GET TOGETHER ON 

Voluntary Health Insurance 

THRIFT 
Corrugated galvanized iron roofing 

and 5-V crimp roofing in all lenghts, 6 
feet to 12 feet. 

QUALITY 

7tee 744,469 - ZeitA Veyeleg 
Stead- 0-Plige Sdatreees 

GRADE-A INK A pretty good stock of black and gal- 
vanized pipe and fittings. 

Let me show you how you can protect yourself 
and your family against the major costs of illness and 
accident. A sound Health Insurance policy will give you 
financial protection, peace of mind and new security. 

You can select the kind of policy you want, at a 
price you can afford to pay. No compulsory payroll tax 
for inferior, Government-regulated medical care. 

An Investment In Voluntary Health Insurance Is 
an Investment In America. 

Window glass, weather strip for doors 
and windows, Vim-lite glass cloth f o r 
storm windows and doors. See us for 
your needs. 

Assures maximum number of copies per Inking. For 
open or closed style cylinder dupticaters-i-any type 
sterna. Contains no Injurious oat or &taloa& WEI sari 
cake or dry on Ink pad or-cylinder. 

PACT( 	 $2.00 pet pease 
THRIFT QUAUTY 	!MACK 	 Ise nag 

% stet tie sesa sea oda 4 pay oegiliatibis4 "MEV 

-_ 444114t VOIO -carita 7us Vivettattbse eses,40, J. C. Harphm Agency Blacklock Home 
Mid Auto Supply 

Your FIRESTONE Dealer 

THE VOLUNTARY WAY IS THE AMERICAN WAYI MUNDAY LUMBER CO. The fiunday Times 



Editor's note: The Knox Frain 
le Philosopher on his Johnson 
grim farm on Miller Creek has 
aiica ea this week, which nobody 

likely to take him up on. 
Dear editar: 

Now that t he elections 
ov* and the best man won, as 
th 	say, although I didn't en- 
counter no statement from any-
body in the runnin this year 
which would imply anybody ex-
cept himself was warth shoot in 
the rest of the skunks which it's 
surprisin the country has been 
able to live with even this long, 
but now that the election is over 

are 

Friday, Nov. 24 
Saturday Matinee.  

Jim Bannon .n . . 

"Cowboy and the 
Prizefighter" 
Also SERIAL and 

SHORT SUBJECTS 

Saturday, Nov. 25 

"The Reformer 
and the Redhead" 
Starring Dick Powell and 

June Allyson 

SHORT FEATURES 
ADDED 

Sunday and Monday 
November 26.27 

Marie Wilson in . . . 

"My Friend Irma 
Goes West" 

Also COMEDY and 
NEWS 

Tuesday and Wednesday 
November 28.29 

"The Lawless" 
With MacDonald Carey and 

Gail Russell. 

INTERESTING 
SHORT FEATURES 

Thursday, Nov. 30 

Penny Singleton and Arthur 
Lake in . . . 

"Blondie's 
Secret" 

The new signal-wire circuit that gives you 

even, luxurious. sunshiny warmih—oll 
night long. 

How the new G-E Blanket is li:.hter than 

N ever—sturdier than ever—how it lakes 

the place of three ordinary blankets. 

THE MUNDAY TIMES, THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 23, 1950 

Knox Prairie Philosopher Wants 
To Get Up In The Big Income Group 

I Which Claims It's Taxed To Death 

Planting Seed 
May Be Short For 

1951 Cotton Crop GOREE 

THEATRE 

I
People, Spots in The News 

has increased its content in fib-
er and bolls already open. The 
germinating power of cotton-
seed decreases rapidly if the 
moisture is 12 percent or above. 

Drying and proper storage to 
maintain the moisture at less 
than 12 percent is recommended 
by the Cotton Council to pre-
serve the quality of planting 
seed. 

STREET TO SKY in Korea. 
Townspeople line up to 

• watch U.S. recon plane take 
off from road in Hamhung. 

Mrs. Sunset Boone and Mrs. 
Frankie Boone of Lubbock, vis-
ited in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. C. Spann over the week end. 

,•••• 	' 

-Nr5P 
Lvt 

Miss Carolyn Hannah attend-
ed the Hardin-Simmons and 
West Texas State football game 
in Abilene last Saturday. 

.1 A 

The problem of obtaining good 
planting seed is one of the most 
critical facing cotton farmers in 
their effort to produce 16,000,000 
bales or more in 1951, the Na-
tional Cotton Council said today, 
urgin producers to save their 
good seed and store them prop-
erly. 

The Council emphasized that 
weather conditions and other 
factors have prevented many 
cotton farmers from producing 
enough good seed to meet their 
needs in planting acreage next 
year. Cotton growers who have 
produced more planting seed 
than they need are urged to save 
their surpluses in order to sup-
ply less fortunate farmers. 

The small cotton crop this 
year and wet weather during 
the boll opening and harvesting 
period are two factors which 
have combined to add to the ser-
iousness of the cottonseed situa-
tion, t h e Council explained. 
Rainy weather in many areas 
has prevented evaporation of 
moisture from opening bolls and 

and the country seems to be 
holdin together about the same, 
I have come to a startlin con-
clusion. 

LARGEST conveyor belt ever 
built in single roll shown ready 
for shipment from new $5,000,000 
B. F Goodrich belt plant in Ak-
ron. Roll stands 15 feet high and 
weighs 45,000 pounds. 

Fifer Cough Relief 
When new drugs or old fail to stop 
your cough or chest cold don't delay. 
Crcomulsion contains only safe, help-
ful, proven ingredients and no nar-
cotics to disturb nature's process. It 
goes right to the scat of the trouble to 
aid nature soothe and heal raw, ten-
der, inflamed bronchial membranes. 
Guaranteed to please you or druggist 
refunds money. Creomulsion has stood 
the test of many millions of users. 

CREOMULSION 
relieves Coughs, Chest Cold; Acute Bronchlthl 

MMEIIIIIIMININIIIMalmmosmammEr  
:4(A cif e)8i 

JUMPING OFF early is 
seven-year-old Vicki Madi-

ll es shown calrfily taking five-
foot jump at National Horse 
	 Show in New York. Attention, Farmers 

e., 

o 

I would like to have my taxes 
raised. 

That is, provided I can get in 
the same shape a lot of big peo-
ple of the country are in. 

I read the other day in a 
newspaper which a north wind 
blew in from my neighbor's 
house, I get his trash in the win-
ter, he gets mine in the summer, 
which saves both of us from 
pickin it up at either season, no 
use wastin energy when the 
wind will do it for you later on, 
as I say, I read where a lot of 
folks is complaining that taxes 
are eatin em up, as they put it. 
Big corporations, big individuals 
they all join in in complainin, 
saying opportunity has been 
banished from this country, in-
itiative has been stilfled, and it 
don't do no good to make any 
money because taxes takes it 
all, but I can't help noticin the 
money continues to pile up in 
the banks and more new cars 
has been made and sold this 
year than ever before. In fact, 
I noticed the third quarterly re-
port for big business this year 
revealed the highest profits, af-
ter taxes was paidi  in the hist-
ory of the nation, and only yes-
terday read where individual's 
incomes was also at the high-
est peak in history, and I been 

We have just what you need for deep 
flat breaking or heavy chiseling . . . 

Mr. Dan Goldsmith, 3024 Cur-
ron Road, Louisville, Ky., owner of 
Coogla Cut Rate Store at 935 West 
Broadway, says there just aren't 
enough words in the English lan-
guage to praise HADACOL cor-
rectly. He says he knows most 
folks don't realize what a change 
HADACOL can make in their life 
if their systems are defiicient in 
Vitamins B', B2, Iron and Niacin. 

Here is Mr. Goldsmith's state-
ment: 

One Army surplus Cletrac. Motor 
has been completely overhaul, ready to 
go to work. 

ARMY SCORES againSt Pennsylvania via 10-yard pass from 
Bob Blaik, son of Army coach, to end John Weaver. Cadets beat 
Quakers in Philadelphia, 28 to 13, to run their unbeaten streak 
to 26 games. 

PRICED TO SELL 

MUMMY TRUCK & TRACTOR CO. 
"The FARMALL House" Mr. and Mrs. H. F. Jungman 

were business visitors in Abi-
lene last Saturday. 

thinkin. 
Now my income ain't in that 

shape, it ain't quite enough to 
get by on, the same as it's been 
for years, and I have decided 
I would like to swap places or 
move over and get into that 
group being taxed to death. 

I guarnantee I will holler just 
as loud and long, complain just 
as much, predict the end of civ-
ilization, if somebdy will man-
age to get my income up to the 
level of these fellers being tax-
ed to death. 

In the meantime, until I get 
there, I aim to holler about tax-
es anyway. I'm in practice. I 
got the know-how, if I just had 
the income to go with it. 

Yours faithfully, 
J. A. 

Photographs 

Are Treasured 

Always! 

tesOtE PAYWAD. „ 
•vv•N -"xs• 

.1 
Let us serve you with photo-

graphic needs, with quality 
work and quality materials. 

• Kodak Developing 

• Commercials 

4 

•X•S\ 

i":C•X;Ck'S.8awv.. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sidney Lee of 
Fort Worth spent the week end 
here with Sidney's mother and 
brother, Mrs. 0. W. Lee, and 
Harvey Lee. 

BLOHM STUDIO 
(TASKELI., TEXAS 

Just North of Post Office 

"Before I started taking HADA-
COL I was run down and nervous 
— and had a hard time sleeping 
nights. With my work in the store 
I have to spend sometimes 14 hours 
a day on my .feet. Since I am in 
the retail business I saw how many 
folks were asking for HADACOL 
so I decided to try it myself. After 
the first couple of bottles I could 
tell a definite improvement. Now I 
have all the pep and energy in the 
world, my nerves are steady as 
ever and I really do get a good 
night's rest. HADACOL is won-
derful — I not only take it, but 
roommend it to all my customers. 
I praise the day Senator Dudley J. 
LeBlanc put HADACOL on the 
market." 

HADACOL Is So Different 
in-Thousands are benefiting from 
HADACOL ... whose systems lack 
Fitamins fit/ Ba, Iron and Niacin. 
HADACOL is so wonderful be-
cause HADACOL helps build up 
the hemoglobin content of your 
blood (when Iron is needed) to 
carry these great Vitamins and 
Minerals to every body organ —
to every part of the body. 

Give remarkable HADACOL a 
chance and if you don't feel better 
with the first few bottles you take 
— you get your money back. Only 
$1.25 for Trial Size; Large Family 
or Hospital Size, $3.50. If your 
druggist does not have HADACOL, 
order it direct from The LeBlanc 
Corporation, Lafayette, Louisiana. 

1960, the LeBlanc 'Corporation. 

1r 
Seeeizen, eonoite FOR SALE! 

v: • 

IT'S A MATTER OF 

better weight distribution 
You can haul more payload than ever in a 
Dodge "Job-Rated" truck, because the load 
is better distributed. Most trucks carry too 
much of the load on the rear axle—too little 
on the front. Because the engine of a Dodge 
"Job-Rated" truck is moved forward and the 
front axle back, both axles carry the right 
proportion of the load. That means you can 
haul biggrr payloads without overloading. 

NOT THIS The payload on most trucks—
like the girl in this boat —rides 
too far to the rear. Result: 
there's too much weight aft, 

_ 	not enough forward. 

...for low-cost transportation BUT THIS In "Job-Rated" trucks, the load is 
moved forward—as the girl is now positioned. 
Results: proper weight distribution— bigger 
payloads —easier handling. 

t• 	\••••... 

N.t • 4.-rr--kcs • „5e6k. 	 <>:. • 	• 

POWER:. . . 8 great truck en-
'zines—each "Job-Rated" for 
:'LUS power. 

L:CONOMY:.. priced with 
-'se lowest. "Job-

.
Rated" for de- 

;,endability and long life. 

s:GGER PAYLOADS: ...carry 
more without overloading axles 
or springs because of "Job-
Rated" weight distribution. 

EASIER HANDLING: ...sharp- 

er turning! Parks in tight places. 
"Job-Rated" maneuverability! 
COMFORT:... widest seats ... 
windshield with best vision of 
any popular truck, Air-cushioned, 
adjustable "chair-height" seats. 
SAFETY: ... finest truck brakes 
in the industry . . . hand brake 
operating independently on pro-
peller shaft on all models-1/2-ton 
and up. 

NEW! Oral FLUID DRIVE! Available on 1/2 -, %- and 1-ton 
models ... for longer truck life, lower upkeep costs. 

D 
	fOhY 

/ 
Ask us for interesting Fluid Drive booklet. 

......... 	 piked a tilt knit 
Blankets 

, 	-Ct.:. • 

Automatic Electric 

Wait atfiehtativalubill 

Reeves Motor Company 
Phone 74 

IMP 

64 Automatic Blankets launder easily and come in four lovely colors: 

rose, blue, green, and cedar. They're available in sizes to fir any type bed. 

COME IN AND SEE FOR YOURSELF... 

How th• r•markabl• bed-side control 

keeps your bed at a perfect temperature 

for real sleeping comfort. 

How 1,000,000 G-E Blankets cue already 

making Americans "sle•p-happy." 

The best aid to health and beauty 

is a good night's sleep. You 

%yin fall asleep faster and sleep 

sounder in a bed that is warm all 

over and stays that way all night. 

With a G-E Automatic Blanket, 

you can select the personal 

warmth you like best. Just set the 

dial on the bed-side control. 

this "just-right" warmth is auto- 

matically maintained . 	regard- 

less of temperature changes... all 

night long. 

Let us show you 

what Modern 

Automatic Sleeping 

Comfort can mean 

to you!  

WestTecas Utilities 
amfiany Munday, Texas 

THE CHOICE OF CHAMPIONS! Chosen by 49 out of 86 state champion truck drivers at the National Truck Roadeo 



At Roxy, Tues., Wed., and Thurs. 

James Newton and Bobby Driscoll team in Walt Disney's 
technicolor presentation of Robert Louis Stevenson's adventure 
"Treasure Island." 

ki! 
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BE COMPLETELY SATISFIED 

SELECT THE 

FCT WORTH STAR-TELEGRAM 
Amon Carter, President 

LARGEST CIRCULATION IN TEXAS 
OVER 200,000 DAILY AND SUNDAY 

For your family newspaper next year while the reduced 

vearly BARGAIN DAYS RATES ore in effect. Now for a 

short time. 

$13.95 DAILY AND SUNDAY 
312.60 DAILY WITHOUT SUNDAY 

Our Bargain Days Offer saves the Reader as much as 
$4.05 on an $18 big Metropolitan Daily newspaper. And 
remember, there Is no substitute for THE STAR-TELE-
GRAM. It is the one newspaper the whole family will 
enjoy—unequalled, unsurpassed in Texas and the South-
west. 

Act quickly, fill out the coupon below, hand to your near-
est Hometown Agent or send direct. With the newsprint 

situation such as it is the offer may soon be withdrawn. 

Gentlemen: I wish to subscribe to the Daily and Sunday, 

or Daily without Sunday STAR-TELEGRAM next year. 

Please send to— 

TOWN 	  STATE 	  

No port-year orders accepted on the BARGAIN DAYS 

RATES. By Mail Only .  

WILLIAM J. BROWN, head of 
Titche-Goettinger Co., Dallas, is the 
newly elected president of the 
Council of Texas Retailers' Asso-
ciations. The Council, a federation 
of 11 statewide retail associations 
whose members number some 26,000 
merchants and businessmen 
throughout Texas, has announced 
that it will oppose needless spend-
ing in state government and a 
state sales tax, state income tax or 
similar taxes in Texas. 

Other newly elected officers are 
%ice-presidents R. C. Houlihan, Ft. 
Worth and R. Don Herod, Houston 
and secretary-treasurer, H. E. Dill, 
Dallas. 

FOR SALE—Montgomery-Ward 
electric washing machine, ex-
cellent shape, $50.00. See C. 
C. Webb, 8 miles northeast of 
Munday. 	 17-2tp 

WANTED--Waitresses for cafe. 
Pay is excellent. Al's Coffee 
Shop. 	 ltc 

FOR SALE-157 acres, 84 in 
cultivation,73 in pasture. Lo-
cated 18 miles northeast of 
Haskell. Half in minerals. 
$75 per acre. See John Wal-
lace, 5 miles north of Haskell, 
Texas. 	 17-tap 

FOR RENT—Three room house, 
furnished. See W. 0. Mays. 
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For Your 

Thanksgiving 
DINNER 

or a Perfect CHRISTMAS GIFT! 

Visit our processing rooms to see the 

• BABY BEEF CURED, HICKORY 
SMOKED TURKEYS 

• DRESSED TURKEYS 

• HICKORY SMOKED CURED 
HAMS 

• BEEF---That is Killed Properly 
and Aged Properly. 

You can purchase beef in any amount 
From one beef to one steak! Guaran- 
teed to be tender. 

THE MUNDAY TIMES, THURSDAY, NOVEMBER 23, 1950 

!cracker Krumbs--- 
(Continued from Page One) 

Bonner Barton Is 
Playing Ball With 

Champion Teams 
Bonner Barton, son of Mr. and 

Mrs. C. A. Barton, is playing 
ball with championship teams 
with the Tempelhof Air Base in 
Germany. His team recently be-
came Berlin's 1950 Touch Foot- 

rr 

down to a more normal speek 
and live longer. 

. • * • 
And be thankful for the many 

things that a r e ours this 
Thanksgiving! 

ball champions, and Bonnet's 
part in the play is revealed in 
the following paragraph from 
the Berlin Observer: 

"Late in the final quarter, the 
Tempelhof team again drove 
deep into Hospital territory. Un-
able to drive through the stiff-
ened defense of the Medics, 
Martina attempted a 30 yard 
field goal, but the ball fell short 
of the uprights by inches. Hos-
pital then took over and tried to 
pass, but Flyer line backer Bar-
ton intercepted a flat pass and 
scampered into the end zone to 
complete the day's scoring." 

Bonner also played baseball 
with the Flyers, being one of 
the pitchers. Their games took 
them to London, Paris and Vien-
na,1  Austria. 

He was present at the dedi-
cation of the Freedom Bell in 
Berlin. The German people gave 
our General Clay a great ova-
tion as he dedicated the bell. 

Bonner has been stationed at 
Templehof Air Base since July 
1948, being there during the air-
lift. 

It Pays To Advertise 

Mr. and Mrs. Leland Hannah 
and Charlotte atended the foot-
ball game between Hardin-Sim-
mons University and West Texas 
State College in Abilene last 

Saturday. 

Heads Texas Retailers 
Mr. and Mrs. R. M. Alman-

rode and daughter, Miss Bar-
bara, left Wednseday for Mena 
and Hatfield, Ark., to spend the 
Thanksgiving holidays with 
relatives. 

HARRELL'S 

NEWEST 

RCA VICTOR 

CONSOLE 
PROG RAM ni LOCALS 

Frommty PMA Conmt ittee 

478 Receive 
Chest X-Rays 

wide threat of inflation, and the 
very strong desire to avoid if 
possible the application of price 
and related controls . . make 
it doubly important that suffic-
ient and adequate reserve stocks 
of cotton be retained in this 
country to meet all emergencies. 

"We will continue to keep the 
cotton situation under review. 
Any additional allocations that 
can be safely made, including 
those for the remaining 4 
months of the cotton year follow-
idg the interim period, will be 
determined and announced in 
line with development." 

To protect domestic supplies 
further, export license controls 
on cotton waste will become ef-
fective as of November 9. 

G. C. Collins of San Berna-
dino, Calif., is visiting in the 
home of his sister, Mrs. W. A. 
Baker, and Ruth Baker, this 
week. 

Mrs. Lucille Stodghill a n d 
Mrs. Herbert Stodghill visited 
relatives in Rails last Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Williams 
and Berry visited in Wellington 
last Sunday. 

Mrs. Sebern Jones and daugh-
ter, Carolyn, of San Antonio, wis-
ed friends here several days last 
week and over the week end. 

Miss Dolores Campbell of Ab-
ileen is visiting in the home of 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
Campbell. 

Victrola "45" 
Too Late to Classify 

COTTON EXPORT 
ALLOCATION INCREASED 

Encouraging information 
about cotton crop prospects have 
resulted in another increase in 
the interim cotton export alloca-
tion, B F. Vance, Chairman of 
PMA State Committee, said to• 
day. 

This latest increase of 1,350,-
000 bales brings the allocation 
for August 1, 1950 through 
March 31, 1951, to 3,496,000 
bales. An increase of 146,000 
bales was made in the initial al-
location of 2 million bales on 
August 23. This was the equiv-
alent of the increase shown in 
the final Census Bureau report 
on carryover stocks of old-crop 
cotton. 

In addition, at least 250,000 
bales of U. S. cotton will be ship-
ped to Canada at the end of the 
8-month interim period, a n d 
about 108,000 bales moved to 
other countries before export li-
cense controls went into effect 
on September 8. 

In announcing the increase in 
the allocation, Secretary Bran-
nan said that more reliable in-
formation is now at hand about 
the prospects for obtaining a 16-
million-bale crop next year and 
about the availability of sup-
plies and facilities farmers will 
need to get a crop that size. 

FOR SALE—Good heavy 5-row 
stalk cutter, 2-row slide go-
devil, and 4-wheel trailer. El-
mer Hutchens, Goree, Texas. 

17-2tp 

The new rat poison, Warfarin, 
appears to be one of the most 
effective poisons yet developed 
for controling rats and mice. 
It is poisonous to all warm-
blooded animals, but the amount 
recommended f o r controlling 
rats and mice is so small that 
there is little danger of farm 
animals or people being poison-

1 ed accidentally. 

Mrs. Addle Lane left Tuesday 
for El Paso to visit in the homes 
of her sons for the holidays. 

78 rpm changer 

AM-FM radio 

Mrs. R. M. Almanrode, chair-
man of the committee which 
sponsored the visit of the mo-
bile X-ray unit here last week, 
reported that a total of 478 per-
sons received chest X-rays here 
Wednesday and Thursday of 
last week. 596 person received 
X-rays at Knox City several 
days earlier. 

This number is short of the 
number last year, over 1,500 re-
ceiving X-rays at Munday last 
year. 

Mrs. Almanrode expressed her 
thanks to the Munday Truck 
and Tractor Company, which 
provided space for the unit; A. 
H. Mitchell of West Texas Utili-
ties Co., Mrs. Ben Bowden, Mrs. 
Joe Patterson and the club wo-
men who came to help, and ev-
eryone who helped with the pro-
gram in any way. FOUND—A pair of glasses, you 

can pick them up at the Grif- 
fith Oil Company. 	it 

FOR SALE—Two new houses 
in Goree, being completed 
this week. A 2-bedroom stuc-
co on pavement with garage 
and breezeway, and one 3 
blocks off pavement, two bed-
rooms with 105 siding. Modern 
in everyway. Virgil Edwards, 
Goree, Texas. 	 17-tie  

Neil Chastain spent the week 
end in Spur visiting friends and 
relatives. 

"The Department has recog-
nized at all times the national 
and interenational interest in ex-
porting as much cotton as poss-
ible in order to hold foreign cus-
tomers and to help stabilize the 
countries which are now and for 
a long time have been depend-
ent upon the U. S. for raw cot-
ton," the Secretary said. 

"On the other hand, the uncer-
tain interenational situation, the 

Mrs. Etta Webb visited in the 
home of her daughter and son-
in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Leon Rea-
gan, in Spur over the week end. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. G. Gafford 
visited in the home of their par-
ents in Coleman over the week 
end. 

"Here's the tire 
want!" 

GOODSEAR 
SUPER-SURE-GRIP 

TRACTOR TIRE 

I 

IIARREU,S 

8 In this 18th Century-style 
cabinet, you find the most mod-
ern of musical masterpieces—
the RCA Victor 45 rpm system. 
Marvelous, distortion-free music 
from tiny, non-breakable, 7-inch 
records and the world's surest, 
fastest record changer! You get 
a 78 rpm changer, too, AM-FM 
radio—and the famous "Golden 
Throat" tone system. There's slor-

111age space for 7-,10- and I2-inch 
records. AC. Choose mahogany, 
walnut finish or blond (slightly 
higher). RCA Victor 9WI06. 
"VP:troton—T. M. Peg. U. S. Pct. Off. 

HARDWARE — FURNITURE 

First choice 
for 2 

reasons! 
For Small Kitchens—Suy A 

GAS RANGE 

Deeper soil penetration — gnat-

on pull. Goodyear's open center 

tread has straight deep-biting 

lugs. They cut cleanly into the 

soil, penetrate lull depth. full 

length. Straight bars closer to-

gether at the shoulders wedge 

the soil for firmer grip — don't 

"plow out" soil at the aides. 

MODEL 920 

0 N LY 
1 9 1/2" 
WIDE 

2 Balanced straight lug tread de. 

• sign longer wear. Goodyear 

open center lugs are all straight, 

all equal in size and spacing. 

That's why every lug works 

equally, pulls fully, wears more 

evenly. 

BANQUET-SIZE OVEN 
Full 16" x 20" x 14" oven; a 
perfect baker; automatic heat 
control eliminates guesswork. 

SMOKELESS BROILER 
Adjustable to the thickness of 
the meat for perfect broiling; 
roll-out drawer. 

4 TOP BURNERS 
One giant, 3 standard simmer-
control burners; automatic 
lighter; unified grate design 
permits easy moving of heavy 
utensils without lifting. 

See le We're/ 
BIG Range Features—AND Quality 

:oodyear Super-Sure-Grips don't 

cost a penny more. Get them for 
your tractor. 

• se 

Munday 
Locker Plant 

A, \ 

• 

HARRELL'S 
' • " 	-""Mb.‘,..ccknyc,tstt'e,,,\%Wr̀rt1411‘ , 

• Hardware 	Furniture 
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