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Hospital Wing Memorial To Him Knox Teachers 
To Meet Oct. 8th 

At Knox City 

Kracker KrumbS 
Odd Bits Salvaged 

At Random 

Alcoholism To 
Be Discussed At 

Meet Sunday 

Fence Erected 
At Cemetery 

Vera Boy Wins 
Championship At 

Iowa Park Fair Association Begins 
Drive For Funds 

Congratulations to a group of 
men for a job well done. 

* * 
This job means much to the 

future of Munday, and it means 
a saving to the taxpayers of the 
town, as well as the accomplish-
ment of something that, for a 
time, loomed up in the impossible 
column. 

In the field of public health, 
alcoholism is one of the nation's 
worst diseases, being outranked 
only by heart disease, cancer and 
tuberculosis. Alcoholics Anony-
mous, a nation-wide organization, 
has proved that alcoholism can be 
arrested and normal living re-
stored to all who honestly want 
to stop drinking. 

To a community interest in 
public health problems and in the 
welfare of the people, you are 
cordially invited to a public meet-
ing on alcoholism on Sunday, 
October 10, in the Muriday high 
school auditorium. The meeting 
will start at 2 p. m. 

Two speakers from the A. A. 
Group of Lubbock will be here. 
All who can are urged to attend. 
You will hear some of the most 
interesting and absorbing talks 
you have ever heard. 

Dale Jackson, 13, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. M. H. Jackson of Vera, 
was declared grand championship 
winner in the Annual District 
Sears Foundation Gilt Show at 
the annual Texas-Oklahoma Fair 
and Southwestern Oil Exposition 
at Iowa Park on October 4. 

Young Jackson exhibited the-
first place gilt in both the Sears 
Foundation Show and the open 
class for junior Duroc Gilts. 

Tommy Walling, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. R. J. Walling, Sunset, exhib-
ited the third place boar in the 
Sears Show and second place 
Junior Duroc boar. 

Knox County's first place pen 
of 3 fat hogs, exhibited by Don 
Johnson, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Wylie B. Johnson, won third 
place in the Sears Foundation 
Show at Iowa Park. 

Judges for the shnw were F. W. 

The first Knox County Teach-
er's Meeting will be at Knox City 
October 8th. 

Mr. J. R. Steedman is president 
of the County Association. Mr. 
Steedman states that the follow-
ing program will be given, com-
mencing at 10:00 A. M. at the 
Knox City school auditorium: 

Opening Song by audience. 
Introduction of teachers by the 

Superintendent. 
Mr. Frank Richardson, Supt. of 

schools, Henrietta, Texas, will 
speak on State Teachers Associa-
tion and State Legislation. This 
address will be followed by a 
Special Musical number rendered 
by the Knox City school. 

The closing address is to be by 
Mr. 0. C. Cook, Deputy State 
Supt., who will bring greetings 
from State Dept. of Education. 

Supt. Holcomb; Knox City has Martin, Haskell County Agent 
agreed to furnish each visiting and R. a Dunkie, Young County 
teacher a Cafeteria lunch for 25c Agent. 
per plate. 	 The Sears Show is a part of a 

program in which 4-H club boys 
ale given a gilt with the stipula-
tion that each returns the best 
gilt from the first litter. The gilt 
is then presented to another club 
boy, and thus the program is 
perpetuated. 

* 

The Munday cemetery has a 
new fence, at least, one that will 
last for a long, long time and has 
added to the appearance of Mum 
day's "city of the dead". 

The new fence was erected 
last week by employees of the 
City of Munday, and members of 
the cemetery association have ex-
pressed their appreciation to City 
Secretary Harvey Lee and his 
corps of workers for a job well 
done. 

Pointing out the fact that up-
keep of the local cemetery en-
tals  an expenditure of around 
$1,500 per year, the finance com-
mittee this week started a drive 
for funds for the cemetery for 
the next year. 

This drive was scheduled to 
open Thursday morning and will 
be closed as soon as possible. 
Everyone having an interest in 
the cemetery is asked to make a 
contribution toward its upkeep 
and to help make this final rest-
ing place clean and attractive. 

The finance committee is com-
posed of John B. Reneau, R. L. 
Ratliff and Mrs. Roger Williams, 
and contributions may be sent to 
either of these or to the city sec-
retary. 

Those who have moved away 
from Munday and who have 
loved ones buried here have mode 
contributions in the past, and 
they are asked to send their con-
tributions to Harvey Lee, city 
secretary. 

It's a move that's deserving of 
your support, and the finance 
committee feels that the neces-
sary funds will be contributed 
gladly. 

• * *  
We refer to members of the 

school board of Munday Indepen-
dent School District. They have 
spent hours away from their jobs 
and hours at night, working and 
planning for the future of Mun-
day's schools. 

* * * * 
Back yonder several months 

ago, they met and worked and 
planned. They realized that Mun-
day's educational facilities were 
inadequate and that something 
had to be done. 

* 
They met and talked, and 

worked, and planned, and saw 
the condition of our high school. 
They decided that the best and 
only route was to build a greater 
school plant. 

They hit upon a bond election. 
They then wondered how the 
people of the Munday district 
would look upon a bond election. 
They wondered if it would carry. 

* * 
Then came the day of the elec-

tion, and citizens of this section 
proved they were for providing 
educational facilities for their 
children. The bond election carri-
ed by a overwhelming majority. 

• I * 
This made our school board, 

and the superintendent, very 
happy. They visualized a greater 
school plant for Munday. With 
the $110,000 in bond money, they 
would build a plant that would 
take care of our present and fut-
ure needs. 

• 

r 

Farm Bureau 
Meet For Knox 

Set For Monday 
*41 

Moguls Play 
Last Home Game 

Here Friday 

* 

Ted Russell of Vera, who re-
cently attended an area farm 
bureau meeting at Wichita Falls, 
announced a similar meeting fot 
Knox County farmers, to be held 
at Benjamin on Monday night, 
October 11. 

A large number of farmers and 
ranchers are expected to attend 
this meeting, at which time cap-
able speakers will be present to 
discuss the workings of the farm 
bureau. 

A membership drive for Knox 
county is expected to be started 
soon after this meeting. All in-
terested citizens of the county 
are urgently requested to be pre-
sent and hear the details of this 
organization. 

New Names Are 
Added CDA List Unless some open dates are 

filled with games at home, next 
Friday night will be the last 
chance football fans will have to 
see the 1948 Munday Moguls in 
action on their home field. All 
remaining games on scheduled 
are to be played away from 
home. 

The Moguls will meet their old 
rivals, the Anson Tigers, here 
next Friday night. The Tigers are 
pretty much in the same category 
as the Moguls, having a some-
what weak team this year. 

The locals are continuing work-
outs this week in an effort to 
improve their brand of football, 
which definitely needs improve-
ment from the type that was 
played against Rule last Friday 
night. Fans are expecting to see 
a more spirited and smoother 
working team in action for the 
final home game. 

- noon, October 17, with elaborate 
ceremonies. The dedication pro-
gram will start at two o'clock. 

Visiting hours for viewing the 
new wing, etc., have been set 
from 2 to 5 p. m. Nurses will con-
duct groups of visitors through 
the new wing, the nursery, the 
operating room and other parts 
of the addition. Refreshments 
will be served. 

Detailed plans are not yet com-
plete, and they will be announced 
in next week's edition of the 
Times. 

Dr. T. S. Edwards, above, belov-
ed pioneer physician and surgeon 
and father of dhe Knox county 
hospital, will belsignally honored 
on Sunday, October 17, when the 
new wing to the hospital will be 
formally dedicated to him. 

The new wing, known as the 
T. S. Edwards memorial addition 
to the hospital, has been complet-
ed, and L. J. Hill,4contractor, will 
turn it over to the hospital board 
this week. 

The formal opening and dedica 
tion are slated for Sunday after 

With the membership well over 
the 150 mark, more citizens of 
the community are becoming 
members of the Community De 
velopment Association. Eight new 
members were reported this week 
by Winston Blacklock, chairman 
of the membership committee. 
They are as follows: 

Don Boyles 
R. J. Walling 
R. L. Ratliff and Son 
Hughes-Dayton Imp. Co. 
George Nix 
L. B. Patterson 
Harvey Lee 
Rev. Wm. G. Barr 

Funeral For Patsy 
Marie Brazell Held 

Here Wednesday 
* 

Plans went forward. The bond 
election was approved by the at-
torney general; bonds were issu-
ed and sold, and bids were ask-
ed for construction of the new 
addition. 

Grand Jury Returns Total Of 11 
Indictments At Meeting On Monday 

Last Rites For 
Mrs. Hudson Are 

Held Wednesday 

• • * * 
In the meantime; the board 

took upon its shoulders the res-
ponsibility to tearing down the 
old high school building, using 
the materials and building the 
new lunch room. 

* * 	* 
This was dime without a con-

tract, labor being used, board 
members and • the superintend-
ent and others supervising the 
work. And a right smart saving 
was brought about by this meth- 
od. 

Four County Girls 
Attending T.S.C.W. 

Funeral services for Patsy 
Marie Brazell, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. E. V. Brazell of Mun-
day, were held at two-thirty 
Wednesday afternoon from the 
Church of Christ, conducted by 
Minister D. L. Ashley. 

Patsy Marie passed away at 
the Knox county hospital last 
Sunday, after an illness of about 
two days. She became ill on Fri-
day and was taken to the hospital 
Saturday. 

Born at Munday on March 17, 
1946, the child was two years, six 
months and 16 days of age. 

Besides her parents, she is sur-
vived by the following brothers 
and sisters: Lloyd of Munday, 
Delbert, who is serving in the 
Army in Japan; Charles, Oma 
Jean, Joan, Bennie Ray, Harold 
Wayne, Bettie Mae and Virgil 
Arlie Brazell, all of Munday. Her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. E. J. 
Brazell of Munday and H. C. Gra-
ham of Bonham, also survive. 

The body was laid to rest in 
Johnson cemetery, with the Ma-
han Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements. Pallbearers were 
Tom Browning, Carl Conwell, 
Lonnie Offutt, and Roddy Grif- 
fith. 

Sunset Perfects 
P.T.A. Organization 

A P.T.A. organization, the 
first in several years, was per-
fected last Saturday night at Sun-
set Rural High School. This came 
as a result of the community 
night activities at the school. 

Officers of the P.T.A. are: 
Mrs. Bryan Cammack, president; 
Mrs. T. J. Partridge, vice presi-
dent; Mrs. Weldon Floyd, secre-
tary, and Mrs. Moody Johnson, 
treasurer. 

The membership drive is being 
planned, and will likely get under 
way at the community night 
meeting next Saturday night. 

Sunset Seniors To 
Sponsor Lecture 

The Senior class of the Sunset 
Rural High School is sponsoring 
Mr. John Koen, who is an artist, 
humorist and cartonist, on Tues-
day night, October 12th, at 8 
o'clock. 

One of his paintings will be of 
"Star of Bethelem". 

Mr. Koen has lectured at the 
Sunset school before and we are 
happy to have him back again 
this year. 

The public is cordially invited 
to attend and the general admis-
sion will be twenty five cents. 

Denton—Two girls from Mun-
day are among the 2015 students 
enrolled at Texas State College 
for Women for the fall term. 

Two hundred and three out of 
254 Texas counties are represent-
ed in the registration figure as 
well as 23 students from seven 
foreign countries and 331 regis-
trarts from 31 other states. 

A back-to-normal enrollment for 
the first time since the war plus 
facilities being added in the cur-
rent $3,000,000 building program 
are expected to result in top-not-
ch housing and classroom accom-
odations at the, college. 

The students are Misses Doro-
thy Maxine Hill and Charlotte 
Ann Williams. 

Knox City girls are Misses Al-
ma Mable Edwards and Joyce 
Carlyne Jones. 

* * * * 
Because offers for demolishing 

the old building were to the ef-
fect that those making the offer 
would do it for the materials. 
The school board salvaged several 
thousand dollars worth of mater- 
ials out of it. 

* * * * 
Time came for letting the con-

tract for remodeling the present 
high school building and constru-
cting an addition thereto. 

• * • * 
It looked like everything was 

"in the gravy" for the school 
board. But they found it wasn't 
in the frying pan, but in the fire. 

* * * * 
Bids made according to archi-

tect's plans were too high. They 
amounted to more than the 
amount of money raised by the 
bond election. 

* * * 
What to do, and how to do it? 

The stone wall they were up 
against must give somewhere. 
.A.pd give it did! 

* • 

Cotton Ginnings 

Munday Girls Are 
Initiated Into H.S.U. 

Cowgirl Organization 
Two Munday girls, Miss Patsy 

Campsey, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Brooks Campsey, and Miss 
Carolyn Hannah, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leland Hannah, are be-
ing initiated this week into the 
H.S.U. Cowgirls. Membership in 
this organization is coveted 
among girls attending Hardin-
Simmons University, Abilene. 

The local girls were among the 
27 members elected to the organ-
ization this year. The group is 
limited to 60 each year, and the 
Cowgirls take part in athlectics 
and other campus activities. 

Both Miss Campsey and Miss 
Hannah are sophomores at H.S.U. 

Gins,  have been running far in-
to the night, and all night most 
of the time this week, as cotton 
gathering is getting into full 
swing. With what seemed to be 
an oversupply of laborers earlier 
in the season, many farmers are 
now experiencing difficulty in 
getting hands to gather their cot- 
ton crops. 

A check of the Munday gins at 
nine o'clock Thursday morning 
revealed that a total of 2160 bales 
had been ginned locally up to that 
time. 

FOB REDISTRICTING 

Mrs. Carrie Elizabeth Hudson, 
well known pioneer of Knox co-
unty, passed away at her home in 
Knox City on Sunday, October 3. 
She had been a resident of Knox 
county for many years. 

Born September 1 1879, at 
Goodwater, Oklahoma, Mrs. Hud-
son was 69 years, one month and 
two days of age. She was united 
in marriage to I. L. Hudson in 
November, 1898, at Hillsboro. 
She united with the Baptist 
church in early life. 

Surviving her are the following 
children: I. L. Hudson, Jr., Fort 
Worth; Neoma Savage, Stamford; 
Mrs. E. M. Clarke, Ruidosa, N. 
M.; W. B. Hudson, Knox City;.  
Mrs. Ray Akin, Martindale; C. J. 
Hudson, San Juan Bautista, Calif., 
and Mrs. Mat Verhalen, Knox 
City; the following brothers and 
sisters, Mrs. C. G. Hudson, Roch-
ester, J. L. Pate, Lubbock; Hunt-
er Pate, Duncan, Okla., and Mrs. 
Lina Jenkins, Tutle, Oklahoma. 

Funeral services were held front 
the First Baptist church in Knox 
City at two o'dlock Wednesday 
afternoon, conducted by Rev. 
Harthcock, pastor. Burial was in 
the Johnson cemetery at Munday 
by the Warren Funeral Home. 

Pallbearers were Roe Myers, 
Clay Hutchinson, Bob Speck, Wy-
lie Johnson, Ed Johnson, Marlin 
Hester and George Hodges. 

The grand jury of October term 
of District Court convened the 
first of this week and returned 
eleven indictments, including five 
for burglary, four for forgery, 
one for rape and one for conver-
sion. The following is the sub-
stance of the grand jury's report 
and recommendations made to 
District Judge Lewis M. Wil-
liams: 

"We the Grand Jury duly im-
paneled and sworn as such for 
the October Term, A. D., 1948, of 
Knox County, Texas, beg to re-
port as follows: 

"W e have diligently inquired 
all law violations coming to our 
attentions and report into open 
court 11 bills of indictment; 

"We the Grand Jury make the 
following recommendations to the 
Hon. H. T. Melton, Sheriff of 
Knox County, Texas, to-wit: We 
recommend that those places hav-
ing dances be closed on each 
Saturday night at twelve. That 
any place or person refusing to 
close at this time be prosecuted 
under the law. 

"We recommend that carnivals 
coming into this county be closely 
watched and all gambling devices 
be shut down that are found run- 
ning. 

"That a close surveilance of 
marble machines be maintained 
and that appropriate action be 
taken if any complaint is filed. 

"There being no further busi-
ness to come before us at this 
time, we ask to be adjourned un-
til such further time as our ser-
vices as grand jurors are needed. 

"Respectfully submitted, 
B. Arnold, foreman. 

"P. S. Also the Grand Jury de-
sires to thank and commend H. T. 
Melton, sheriff, for his diligence 
and consideration to his official 
duty." 

STEVE GREEN MAKES 
HIS APPEARANCE HERE 

Sunset Home Ec. 
Club Elects New 

Year's Officers 
The Sunset home economics 

club was organized on Wednes-
day, September 29. Nine members 
were present from the home ec-
onomics classes, and the follow- 
ing officers were elected: 

Joy Jones, president; Doris 
Walling, vice president; Ida Mae 
Hamilton, secretary and treasur- 
er. 

The club is looking forward to 
much success in the coming year. 

Weather Report 
Weather report for the period 

Sept. 30th thru Oct. 6th 1948 
as compiled by H. P. Hill, Mun-
day U. S. Cooperative Weather 
Observer. 

* * 
The board members, we might 

add, are J. E. Reeves, president; 
Leland Hannah, John B. Scott, 
Ray Holcomb, J. C. Elliott, Gene 
W. Harrell and R. L. Ratliff. 

• • * 
They'd meet in Jim Reeves' of- 

fice. They'd meet in Lela nd Han- 
. 

	

	nah's drug store. They'd meet 
when and were convenient, re-
gardless of the time of day or 
night. 

Robert Green made the an-
nouncement Wednesday morning, 
and Lee Ann and Judy have a 
little brother to play with! 

He arrived at the Knox county', 
hospital Tuesday night. His name 
is Robert Stephen, and he's gonna 
be called Steve. He weighed eight 
pounds and two ounces, and he 
appears to be a real boy for his 
age! 

Parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Green. Both of them are 
doing nicely, too. 

LOCAL PTA BEGINS 
MEMBERSHIP DRIVE 

The P. T. A. membership drive 
is now underway and will contin-
ue through next Friday, October 
15th. Dues are fifty cents. 

The P.T.A. urges all interested 
persons to pay their dues at this 
time in order to complete the roll 
for the year book. A five dollar 
reward goes to the room with 
the nearest 100% membership. 

Mr. and Mrs. Boyd Meers are 
announcing the arrival of a son, 
born on Monday, October 4th, at 
the Knox County hospital. The 
little boy topped the scales at 
nine pounds and seven ounces. 

BIRTH ANNOUNCEMENT 

Mr. and Mrs. Luke Birkenfeld 
are the proud' parents of a son 
born on Monday, October 4, at 
the Knox County hospital. Both 
mother and little son are doing 
nicely. 

New Parts Man At 
Ford Tractor Agency 

J. W. Sherman, formerly of 
Vernon, started his duties this 
week with the firm of J. L. Stodg-
hill, local Ford tractor agency. 

Mr. Sherman, known as 
"Shorty", is an experienced parts 
man, and he will have charge of 
the parts department. He will be 
glad to help all Ford tractor own-
ers in every way possible. 

The public is cordially invited 
to come around and meet this 
new employee. 

Temperature 
LOW HIGH 

1948-1947 1948-1947 
Sept. 30 	45 	63 	88 	90 
Oct. 1 47 56 89 88 
Oct. 2 50 55 89 90 
Oct. 3 51 60 91 89 
Oct. 4 59 62 90 93

1 

Oct. 5 62 61 86 95 
Oct. 6 65 65 82 90 

Rainfall to date this year, 16.94 
inches. Rainfall to this date last 
year, 17.30 inches. 

MISS FRANCES SMITH 
WINS COLLEGE HONORS 

Miss Frances Smith of Mun-
day, who is attending Howard-
Payne College in Brownwood, 
was recently elected president of 
the Y. W. A. and vice president 
of the Life Service Band. 

I Miss Smith,. daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. S. G. Smith of Munday, 
will complete work on her degree 

I this year. 

John Ben Shepperd,- Gladewater 
attorney and former president of 
the U. S. Junior Chamber of Com-
merce, has accepted the chairman-
ship of the recently organized Texas 
Committee for Redistricting. The 
committee, which is non-political, 
seeks to assure fair representation 
in the Texas Legislature for all 
counties by urging voters to support 
Amendment Two on the general 
election ballot November 2. Passage 
of Amendment Two will permit re-
districting in Texas for the first 
time in 27 years, Shepperd pointed 
out. 

'• • • * 
They'd talk and bicker. They'd 

have varied opinions, but they'd 
most generally always arrive at 
some concrete decision. 

• • * * 
People learned that all bids for 

construction were rejected. We 
won't get a new school, they 

(Continued on last Page) 
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NOTICE TO CREDITORS 
OF ESTATE 

Notice is hereby given that or-
iginal Letters of Administration 
upon the estate of J. B. Stevens, 
deceased, were granted to the un-
dersigned on the 13th day of 
September, 1948, by the County 
Cciurt of Knox County. All per-
sons having claims against said 
estate are hereby required to 
present the same to me within 
the time prescribed by law, at my 
residence and post office address 
in Munday, Knox County, Texas. 

VERA STEVENS, 
Administratrix of the Estate 
of J. B. Stevens, Deceased. 

8-4tc. 

• 

"What a Man Does For Himself Dies With Him— 

What He Does For His Corn munity Lives On and On." 

THE MUNDAY TIMES 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES 

In first zone, per year-- 	  $2.00 

In second zone, per year 	$2.50 
The Munday Times is Democratic, yet supporting only what it 

believes to be right, and opposing what It believes to be wrong, 
regardless of party policies, publishing news fairly, impartially. 

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC: Any erroneous reflection upon the 
character, standing, or reputation of any person, firm or cor-
poration which may appear in the columns of this paper, will 
be gladly corrected upon duo notice being given to the publisher, 
at the Munday Times office. 

Friday, October 8th 

Roy Rogers and Trigger 
in . . . Published Every Thursday at Mande: 

Aaron Edgar and Grady Roberts . . . Owners 
Aaron Edgar . . . . . . Editor and Publisher 

Entered as second class matter January 4, 1919, 
at the postoffice in Munday, Texas, under Act of 
Congress, March 2, 1879. 

4rr 
"Nightime 

In Nevada" 
With Andy Devine and Bob 

Nolan and the Sons of the 
Pioneers. 

"I can't. I gotta drive with 
one." "For goodness sakes, use both 

hands!" 
'39 

LIMITED MARK-UPS SAVE BILLIONS 
The retailers of this country— against whom 

resentment over high prices is often mistakenly dir-
ected—are as worried about inflation as any other 
group. The retail economy is based upon continued 
mass distribution, precisely as the manufacturing 
economy is based on continued mass production. The 
worst thing that can happen to retailing is to have 
people forced to pare their buying to the bare-nec- 
essity level. 

Retailing has 

—Also Serial— 

"Frank and 
Jesse James" 

:RAZELL & CUPE MOTOR SERVICE 
"COME IN PLEASE 	GO OUT PLEASED " 

ALL WORK GUARANTEED 

BOX 352 
	

PHONE 242-J 	NIGHT PHONE 307R 

MUNDAY'S NEEDS FOR 1948 

1. A modern and up-to-date high school build-
ing, to care for the present and future educatistal 
needs of our children. 

2. A. waterworks system that meets all re-
quirements of health, sanitation and supply. 

3. A street sweeper that will keep our pave-
went clean enough to be recognized as pavement. 

5. Completion of our drainage and paving pm-
gram, which will probably be accomplished this 
year. 

Weekly Health 
LETTER 

them I Mrs. Glenna Dyke of Walters, 
Oklahoma, returned last Wednes-
day with Mrs. James Dyke and 
daughter for a few days' visit 
here. 

said, and added, "Prevent 
if possible." Issued by Dr. Geo- W. Cox 

M. D., State Health Officer 
of Texas 

LOCALS 
Austin — Sudden seasonal 

changes in the weather during] Mr. and Mrs. Joe B. Norton and 
the fall months often result in son, Gary Wayne, spent the week 
chilling, which in turn is usually end in Greenville, visiting with 
followed by wide-spread incidence Mr. Norton's parents and other 
of the common cold. This disease relatives. 
always spreads rapidly because Mrs. T. J. Mitchell returned 
of the fact that very few people last Thursday from Palo Pinto 

where she spent three weeks with 
her sister, who is ill. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Mitchell at- 
tended the wedding of Mrs. Mit-
chell's nephew at Seymour last 
Saturday morning. 

not created high prices. It has, 
on the contrary, taken every conceivable step to 
prevent them. Long ago, the chain systems volun-
tarily initiated a policy of cutting overhead costs 
wherever p o s s i b l e, and reducing mark-ups to the 
lowest point consistent with safety. 	Typical inde- 
pendent stores followed. The result is that in many 
cases profits are lower now than under OPA. But 
there is a definate limit as to the percentage of in-
creased wholeale prices that can be absorbed. The 
rest must be passed on to the consumer. And that 
is why prices have gone up and up. 

It is impossible to measure exactly just what 
retailing's "limited mark-ups" anti-inflation policy 
has done for us. But it has undoubtedly saved us 
billions, •by holding price increases to lower percent-
ages than would otherwise have been the case. And 
that, in these times of depreciating dollars, has been 
a great service. 

Mrs. T. C. Lowry and J. C. 
Campbell visited with relatives 
and friends in Abilene last Sun- 
day. 

can live isolated lives and in any 
group of crowd of people, cough-
ing, sneezing and spitting will 
scatter millions of cold germs 
among susceptible persons. 

Dr. Geo. W. Cox, State Health 
Officer, says that there are coun-
tless ways of spreading a cold 
other than by coughing, sneezing 

a. PAT DARE - NUR MUTT Mrs. Lyn Hay attended the fun-
eral of a nephew at Seagraves 
last Saturday. She remained there 
until the first of this week, visit-
ing with relatives. 

• Mrs. Ada Byrd and daughter, 
Clara Belle, spent the week end 
in Old Glory, visiting Mrs. J. H. 
Bush. 

Sunday and Monday 

October 10.11 Mrs. Bessie McStay spent sev-
eral days in Vernon last week vis-
iting with her son and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. D. McStay. 

laist.4 ail Wt... an:BMW& 

Moulton Wiggins and Mrs. 
Clara Boaddin attended the foot-
ball game between A. & M. team 
and John Tarleton at Stephenville 
last Thursday. 

IT PAYS TO ADVER I iaE 

We 

Saturday, October 9th 
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O'CONNOR 

WARM 
STEWART 

Photographs 

Are Treasured 
• Always ! 

Harley Davidson 
World's Most Durable 
One-Stop Motorcycle 

SALES and SERVICE 

813 
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Wichita Falls, Texas 
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HEALTH AMBASSADORS 
A group of eight American doctors recently 

made a trip to Poland to exchange medical notes 
with the Polish medical leaders. The visit was non-
political and was a complete success. Dr. Leo David-
off of Montefiore Hospital in New York, chairman 
of the United States group, said: 	"We met as 
friends and exchanged information and experiences  

on the basis of equality and friendship." 
Near the end of their tour the assistant director 

of Poznan University said: "When you first came we 
were very skeptical. We thought you would be con-
temptuous of our meager resources. We did not 
know what you had to offer us and we did not know 
the spirit in which your help would be offered or 
received by us. Now, at the end of your tour, we can 
say that we have all been intrigued by and grateful 
for your contribution." 

This tribute to the American doctors was well 
earned. The doctors rolled up their sleeves and talk-

ed shop, and on top of that they pea-formed more 
than forty major operations while in Poland. 

As private citizens in a private profession they 
were able to extend the good will of the American 
people. Medical men of two countries got together 
and benefited from their combined achievements. 

Much of the success of the visit is attributed to 
the fact that it was one of the few recent instances 
when representatives of America and Poland have 
met on a non-political footing. 	Under socialized 
medicine, political considerations would have come 
first—and health considerations second. As it was, 
the Polish medical profession was given an invalu-
able insight into the achievements of private medi-
cine in the United States. bet us serve you with photo-

graphic needs, with quality 
work and quality materials. 

cies or interests of this country. 	
and spitting. "For instance" the 
doctor said, "if a member of your 

"When we do business in other countries family has a cold and the other 
try to be good citizens there. We do not make fore- members share a common drink- 
ign commitments if we cannot do that and still be . mg glass with him, you may ex- 
in harmony with the foreign policy of the United i pect the whole family to pick up 
States." 	 I the germs he leaves on the glass. 

That is typical of free enterprise in oil and Sometimes a person with a cold 
many other fields. American industry abroad fully thoughtlessly touches his mouth 
realizes its tremendous responsibilities—and it or nostrils with his hand, and  
works in complete cooperation with our government then shakes hands with another 

in advancing the interests of all. 	 person. That person can, and  
very likely will contaminate his 
own mouth or nostrils with his 
hand, and the germs are trans-
mitted into his system. A child 
with a cold may contaminate his 
toys, and the next child that picks 
them up and plays with them will 
certainly obtain the cold germs, 
along with the toys." 

Children, as well as adults, who 
are suffering from a cold should 
be put to bed, and if complete 
rest, light food, and plenty of liq-
uids do not improve his condition 

good measure, it destroys well over $00,000,000 in a short time, the family physs 

worth of property every month. 	
clan should be called. Dr. Cox  
further advised that dressing 
properly for the weather, sensible 
eating, plenty of rest, and avoid-
ing persons with colds can be 
helpful in preventing your own 
infection. Colds are costly in time. 
health, and money, the Doctor 

• Kodak Developing 

Tuesday, Wednesday, 

Thursday, October 12-13-14 

The incredible feats, the 
spectacular thrills of Mr. Base-
ball himself! 

"The Babe 
Ruth Story" 

• Commercials 

Dr. Joseph M. 
Croley 

General Dentistry 
OFFICE HOURS: 

9 to 12 a. m. 	1 to 5 p. m. 
PHONES: 

Office 26 	Res. 321-R 
Eiland-Pendleton Bldg. 

THE FIFTH HORSEMAN 
The official poster for this year's Fire Pre-

vention Week—which will run from October 3-9—
shows, in the background, the Four Horsemen of 
the Apocalypse—war, famine, pestilence, and 

death. 	In the foreground, carrying a flaming 
brand, is the Fifth Horseman—fire. 

That makes a dramatic and thought-provok- 
ing picture. Fire is one of 	most consistent 
killers. Its ravage is especially great among small 
children. And, on top of that, it disfigures and 
cripples thousands of people each year. Then, for 

AMERICAN ENTERPRISE ABROAD 
In some minds, the activities of American com-

panies which do business abroad are viewed sus-
piciously. In that connection a. statement of policy, 
made by one of the largest American oil companies, 
which is engaged in helping develop the petroleum 
resources of the Middle East, is of exceptional in- 

terest. It said: 	"We recognize •that international 
trade relations involve political considerations of 
the highest order. Policies governing such considera-
tions are, of course, the responsibility of our govern-
ment acting in the best interests of all its citizens. 

"We do not expect, and have never sought 
greater protection for our foreign interests than is 
normally afforded by the United States Government 
to any private citizen engaged in overseas trade. 
we inform interested agencies of Government re-
garding any contemplated foreign agreement or act-
ivity of ours that could in any way affect the poli- 

Blohm Studio 
Can fire be prevented? The experts say that 

90 per cent of all fires, great and small, are unnec-
essary. Of all fire's allies, human carelessness is 
by far the most effective. Our collective failure to 
follow the rudiments of fire safety is the basic 
reason why fire waste continues to grow. When 
fire is fought intensively, it always loses. As a 
recent example, the Navy's Bureau of Yards and 
Docks has been carrying on a major fire preven-
tion campaign. In the first quarter of this year 
alone fire damage to its installations were cut by 
nearly $1,500,000. 

Starring William Bendix, 
Claire Trevor and Charles 
Bickford. 

HP SICELL, TEXAS 

Just N4-,L11 of Pest Office 

Aarer:tscrnent 

rom where I sit ... Ay Joe Marsh 

Chevrolet 
Accessories 

Get The Truth! 
REMEMBER 

Dr. Frank C. Scott Repair Work 
White 

Auto Store 

F o r 

We do general repair work on 
cars and trucks and other types 
of repairs. We specialize in .. . 

like beer or ale, and of those who 
swear by nothing but cider. 

And from where I sit, once you've 
got both sides—and faced them 
truthfully, you realize that these 
differences of opinion are a pre-
cious part of what we call Democ-
racy—the right of the individual 
to vote as he believes, to speak his 
mind, to choose his own beverage 
of moderation, whether beer or 
cider. 

Specialist on Diseases 
and Surgery of 

EYE, EAR, NOSE, THROAT 
AND FITTING OF GLASSES 

HASKELL, TEXAS 

Office in Clinic Bldg., 1 Block 
North and 1/2 Block West of 

Haskell Nat'l Bank. 

Called on my good friend "Cappy" 
Miller, who edits the County Bee, 
the other day. And hanging up on 
the wall of Cappy's office is this 
slogan for his paper: 

"Remember there are two sides 
to every question. Get both sides. 
Be truthful." 

A good slogan ... not just for a 
newspaper—for people, too. Be-
cause there'll always be two sides 
to every question: the side of those 
who vote one way, and those who 
vote another—the side of those 
who enjoy a temperate beverage 

• AUTO REPAIRING 

• TRUCK-TRACTOR WORK 

• EXPERT WELDING 

• Overload Springs for 1/2  ton and 

3/4  ton pickups. 

• Seat Covers for 1941-48 Models 

• Chevrolet• Radios 

• Chevrolet Heaters 

Let us figure with you on jobs 
you need, You'll be pleased with 
our service. 

Household supplies, auto ac-
cessories, motor oils, radios, re-
cord players, Leonard refriger-
ators stoves, bolts, tools, 
hardware, batteries and vene-
tian blinds. 

04e  (114A4C Fidelia 
Moylette, D. C. PhC. 

Graduate Chiropractor 

Copyrigh , 1948, United States Brewers Foundation 

Strickland 

Machine Shop R. L. NEWSOM Your Local USED-COW 

Dealer 

REMOVES DEAD STOCK 

Phone 141 — Office Hours 9-6 

Office Closed Each Thursduy 

D. C. EILAND 
M. D. 

PHYSICIAN & SURGEON 

JIM STRICKLAND, Operator 

M. D. 
PHYSICIAN & SURGEON 

— Office Hours — 
8 to 12 A. M. 
2 to 6 P. M. 

Office Phone 24 
Res. Phone 142 

FREE 
Our accessories are all genuine Chev- 

rolet equipment. 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 

For Immediate Service 

PHONE 300 COLLECT 

Munday, Texas 
First National Bank Building 

A Ready Market For 

Your Stock 
CATTLE .. HORSES .. HOGS .. MULES 

REMEMBER... Mahan Funeral 
Home Home Furniture Co. 

& Mattress Factory ••••—•—r- 

Niel Brown 

Chevrolet Co. 
Sales—CHEVROLET—Service 

AMBULANCE SERVICE 

Our Sale attracts more Buyers than 
any Livestock Sale in this Territory! 

AUCTION SALE EVERY TUESDAY 
Lots of buyers are on hand to give highest 

market prices for your livestock. 
WE BUY HOGS, PAYING YOU 50 CENTS UNDER 

FORT WORTH PACKER PRICES. 
Day Phone 	Nite Phone 

201 	201 
MUNDAY, TEXAS 

G 

Joel W. Massey, service manager 
Central Hide and 

Rendering Co. 
—For Your Mattress Work— 

We also have a nice stock of 
New and Used Furniture 

Munday Livestock Commission Co. 
RATLIFF & SON 	 BILL WHITE, Auctioneer 
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• amen,  4.98 20 Piece 
Dinner Set 

Quality White Wood 
Closet Seat 	5.95 
Supreme quality closet seat with a glossy 
white celluloid enamel finish. Solid seam-
less construction makes it a seat that will 
not crack or split under average use. 1% 
inch seasoned stock. 

"Charlie Trippi" 
Football 
Wilson football. Especially made for 
younger players. Covei-  of pebble grain 
Texhide. Value type rubber bladder. Flat 
double lacing for a sure-grip. Official size 
and weight, 15 ounces. 

1.59 Famous Bluestone 
Enamel Roaster 

3.39 

For tender, juicy roasts and fowl that are 
cooked to perfection get our Bluestone 
enamel roaster today! Made of first quali-
ty enamelware in the popular oval shape 
with self-basting top. Sizes 181/2 x12%x71/2  

Beautifully Colored for a lovely Table 
Setting. 
Attractive semi-porcelain dinnerware in 
lovely pastel colors. This fine, lightweight 
ware will give years of service and 
beauty. Consists of 4 each of dinner 
plates, salad plates, fruit dishes, cups and 
saucers. Blue, green, yellow and cocotan 
colors in each set. 

in. 

eallgar  

seas 

-•••••,no 19.95 
1%4 

36 Piece Socket 
Wrench Set 

2.98 26-Inch Hand 

Saw 
High carbon tempered steel blade. 4 guage 
taper ground two ways. Teeth expertly 
filed and set. Keen, long-lasting points. 8 
point crosscut. 

Made of chrome alloy steel. Consists of 8 and 12 point 
sockets, 7/16 to 1 1/16" sizes. Swing head handle, cross 
bar, long speeder, reversible ratchet, extensions, slide 
T handle, short square head handle with cross bar. 
Packed in a metal chest with convenient tray. 

89c 
Mitten Mop 	1.39 
With Handle 
Large size removable mitt style dust' mop. 
Can be used as polisher. 

Revere 4-Qt. 
Aluminum 
Egg Poacher 

Pressure Cooker 	 4 cup poacher that can be used as a 
frying pan or as a food wanner. Saves Time and Energy! 

16.95 2 egg 

Gleaming, stainless steel cooker with 
fast-heating Copper bottom. Visual dial 
registers from 0-15 lbs. Guage is attached 
to cover. Instruction bood included. 

Ceiling Fixture 
Fluorescent Kitchen 

4.95 ./47.47,Wr 

Adaptor type fixture. Completely wired 
with white baked enamel reflector sur-
faces. 110.125 volts, 60 cycle A.C. Silver 
and gold era crowns. Uses 2, T12, 20 watts 
24 inch fluorescent lamps (not included). 

24 Piece 
Flatware Set 

5.95 89c 
4.95 

Made of Silco Stainless Steel 
Elegantly finished and fully mirror polished set in 
smart Liberty pattern. 6 tea and dessert spoons, knives, 
forks. 

3 Pc. Plastic 
Refresher Boxes 
Made of magic styrene plastic that retains 
heat or cold and keeps vegetables gard-
en-crisp. They're a space-saver too . . . 
just stack in your refrigerator. Two 
4x4" jars, one 8,14x4 1/8" jar with covers. 

Kitchen Wall 
Electric Clock 
"Sentinel". Self-starting motor completely 
sealed in oil. White with chr Jrne 

Flatware Chest for 26 pc set 	  $1.00 

When Shopping, See These 

Quality Every-Day Items 

Shop For These Items At 

Every-day Low Prices 

Miro-Matic Cookers Tru-Pink Pinking Shears 	$4.95 

Hanson 200-1b, Cotton Scales 	445 

Health Scales 	 6.95 

Large Rural Mailbox 	 620 

$12.95 

Alca Pressure Cooker 	6.95 

Presto Cookers 	 12.95 

6-Foot Extension Rule 	1.95 

PEARLWICK HAMPERS 
Jumbo size: 191/2x12x28" 	6.49 
Beautiful Pearlwick hampers woven of steel-ribbed fiber 
for extra service—extra wear—extra ventilation! New 
arch-shaped pearloid tops that won't warp and decor-
ator styled furniture legs. Have yours in white with 
black, rose with burgundy, solid blue or green. 

I 

EID'S HARD ARE 
assi 

Munday, Texas 
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Newsoms Celebrate 
Golden Wedding 
Date Recently 

BENJAMIN NEWS Methodist WS CS 
Meets Monday In 
Eiland Home 

County Council 
Meets Oct. lst. 

Local Couple 
Celebrate 48th 
Weddirtg Date 

The W.S.C.S. of the Methodist 
church met in the home of Mrs. 
G. R. Eiland last Monday after-
noon at three o'block for the mon-
thly social and business meeting. 
The house was attractive with 
vases of roses and dahlias. Mrs. 
R. D. Atkeison was co-hostess. 

movement of hogs fell 7 per cent 

under July. 
In comparison with August 19- 

47, movements of sheep gained 22 
per cent; cattle, 19 per cent; and 
hogs, 12 per cent. For the only 
decline, shipments of calves drop-
ped 10 per cent. 

SHIPMENTS OF LIVESTOCK 
AUSTIN—Texas shipments of 

livestock gained 29 percent from 
July to August, the University of 
Texas Bureau of Business Re-
search reported. 

Livestock shipments, totaling 
7,764 carloads, advanced 14 per 
cent from August 1947. 

(Elda Purl Laird, Reporter) 

Mrs. P. W. Laird, Miss Omi-
tene Barnett and 1Virs. Wynelle 
Porter were in Wichita Falls Sat-
urday shopping. 

Mrs. J. F. Draper and Mrs. W. Mr. and Mrs. Carl Jungman 
and children of Vernon visited re-
latives and friends here over the 
week end. 

per cent from July to August; 
sheep, 74 per cent; and cattle, 17 

cent. On the other hand, per 

W. Roberts of Goree, visited in Shipments of calves jumped 89 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Willard 
Kilgore and family Saturday of 
last week. Mrs. Kilgore is the 

You Need Them, And 
We Don't Need Them! 

We have several good show cases we don't need. Ore 

Westen organ and Hobart M. Cable piano. 

Extra good 22 rifle, 1.834 model Chevrolet coupe-picku P, 

ice boxes, end tables, extra nice kitchen cabinet, New Hon 

sewing machine, and really good French made violin. We In }-

or sell., Come see us first. 

Knox County Trading Post 
. MR. AND MRS. EMMETT BRANCH 

• 

The children of Mr. and Mrs. 
F. H. Newsom held open house 
to celebrate their parents golden 
wedding anniversary on Septem-
ber 19th from 2 to 6 o'clock, at 
their home six miles from Wich- 
ita Falls. 

Many beautiful gifts were re-
ceived by the couple and appro-
ximately fifty guests called dur- 
ing the afternoon. 	' 

A record was made of the 
family's conversation during the 
noon hour by Charles Johnson of 
Seymour, to be sent to Mrs. Tiny 
King of Fort Bragg, N. C., who 
was unable to attend. 

The children present were: 
Mrs. James Rayburn and Mrs. 
Deaton Green of Seymour; Bailey 
Newsom, Wichita Falls; and 
Billy Newsom of Alta Loma. 

A nice dinner was set Sunday 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. M. 
B. James of Knox City, with the 
help of the other children, to 
celebrate the 48th wedding anni-
versary of Mrs. James' parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. P. Pierce of Mun- 
day. 

Several birthdays were cele-
brated. They were: Mrs. Mary 
Lou Foshee of Knox City, Octo-
ber 4th; Miss Edith Marie Jones, 
Kn8x City, October 2nd; Mr. Wal-
lace Jackson Hayes, Knox City, 
October 3rd; Miss Janette Pierce, 
Munday, October 15th; and Mr. 
W. G. Pierce of Benjamin, Octo- 
ber 27th. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. 0. Bowden, 
Mrs. John Bowden, Mrs. Mae 
Bowden, Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Jones, Mr. and Mrs. Buck Tidwell 
and Mr. and Mrs. Leland Hannah 
attended the wedding of Dr. Ben 
Bowden and Miss Bettie Jean 
Guthrie at Cisco last Sunday. 

daughter of Mrs. Draper. 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Horton of 

Whitherrhl and Mr. and Mrs. T. P. 
Porter, Sr., of Seymour, were vis-
itors in the home of Mrs. W. A. 
Barnett and family Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Bivins,Mr. 
and Mrs. Rex Patterson and Mr. 
and Mrs. J. C. Patterson attended 
the funeral of Jimmy Ritchie in 
Spur Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Jennings of 
Lubbock, visited in the home of 
Mrs. Jennings parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. R. 'D. Benson and family 
during the past week end. 

Miss Julia Propps of Wichita 
Falls, spent the past week end 
with her parents, 'Mr. and Mrs. 
0. D. Propps and other relatives 
and friends. 

W. F. Phillips, Clyde Hendrix, 
I. V. Cook, J. D. Crockett, G. W. 
Dingus, Gill Wyatt, J. C. Borden, 
H. A. Pendleton, D. E. Holder, 
M. F. Billingsley, W. D. Ford, 
and Miss Shelly Lee. , •.control the cost 

Mrs. Roger Williams has re-
turned from Abilene where she 
had been visiting her mother, 
Mrs. P. B. Broach. 

The theme for the program was 
Alaska, Among the Northern 
Lights, and Mrs. J. C. Borden dir-
ected a very interesting talk on 
missionary work in Alaska, with 
Mrs. Gill Wyatt, Mrs. McStay, 
Mrs. Holder and Miss Shelly Lee 
taking parts on the program. 

In a business meeting, plans 
were announced to begin a new 
study book, On Our Own Door-
step, to be taught by Mrs. It. D. 
Atkeison. Mrs. M. F. Billingsley, 
secretary of supplies, made plans 
for two boxes of clothing to be 
sent to the Philippines, also for 
four sheets to -the Wesley Com-
munity House in San Angelo. 

Mrs. Eiland served punch from 
the lace-covered dining table, and 
Mrs. Atkeison served cake squ-
ares to the following ladies: 

Mmes. J. C. Rice, Oates Golden, Mrs. Wanda Kistenmacher and 
children, Toni Ray and Micheal, 
of Wichita Falls, spent the past 
week end -Visiting in the home of 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Alpine 
Nunley. 

The Knox County Home Dem-
onstration Council met Friday 
afternoon, October 1st, in the as-
sembly room of the court house 
at Benjamin. 

Council voted to have round-
robin achievement day again this 
year in November. Each club 
drew another clubs name to en-
tertain on their achievement day. 

A letter was read from the 
Young county marketing chair-
man asking information on the 
pinking shears Knox county is 
buying cooperatively. 

It was decided that a member 
must be present for at least half 
of the club meetings during the 
year to be considered an active 
member. 

Mrs. Clyde Taylor resigned as 
council secretary and Mrs. Billy 
Hutchens wes elected to serve the 
remainder of 'this year. 

Friday was Union Grove Day 
at council. They had four visitors 
present. 

Reports were given from the 
standing committee on the years 
work thus far accomplished. 

Council officers for the coming 
year were elected as follows: Mrs. 
0. R. Miller, chairman; Mrs. S. 0. 
Turner, vice-chairman; Mrs. It. M. 
Almanrode, secretary; Mrs. G. C. 
Gollehon, treasurer; Mrs. Wesley 
Trainham, parliamentarian; and 
Mrs. Omar Cure, reporter. 

Mr. and Mrs. T. H. Armstrong 
visited Mrs. T. A. Armstrong in 
Bowie last week end. LOCALS 

Now 7,-„,- 
It's Candy Time! 

There were two beautiful cakes 
with lighted candles. All the 
children of Mr. and Mrs. J. P. 
Pierce were present except one, 
H. 0. Pierce of Bridgeport. Mrs. 

H. 0. Pierce is ill and was unable 
to come. Those present were: 
Mr. and Mrs. E. J. Todd, Dallas; 
Mr. and Mrs. W. G. Pierce and 
children, Benjamin; Mr. and Mrs. 
E. L. Pierce and children, Mun-
day; Mr. and Mrs. P. H. Pierce 
and children of Benjamin; Mr. 
and Mrs. W. L. Pierce and child-
ren of Munday; Mr. and Mrs. C. 
H. Hayes and children, Knox City; 
Mr. and Mrs. Valvin Call and son, 
Munday; Mr. Harvey Lee James 
of Munday and Miss Bessie Sue 
Wilson of Gilliland. 

A very nice time was had by all 

Mason Hammack was a busi-
ness visitor .in Lubbock the latter 
part of last week. Mrs. Rose Jones left the latter 

part of laseweek for Midland to 
visit relatives for a few days. 

seen only in national magazines 
officer of the U. S. Army and kitchens that housewives have 

air force recruiting station in  

Abilene, has announced that the 
Women's Army Corps and the 
Women's Air Force recruiting 
sergeant will be at that station 
on October 13 and 14 for the pur-

pose of interviewing applicants. 

. 
VEAL 
r. 

OUTLETS 

TO NATIONAL-MEET 
Mrs. R. M. Almanrode left Sat-

urday for Tuls a, Okla., where 
she is attending the national 
home demonstration meeting this 

Carlton Mane of Jacksboro week. She is also visiting her 
as a visitor in Munday last sister, Mrs. Grace Humphries of 
hursday. 	 Oklahoma City. 

Mrs. Tommy Latimer of Odessa 
was a Sunday visitor in Munday: 

w 
T 

The New Look In 
Women's Army Corps Kitchens Features 

To Take Applicants Color, Convenience 

Capt. Wayne Hall, commanding Three modern, colorful all-gas 

can be seen in reality in the Nat-
ural Gas Building at the Texas 
State Fair, Dallas, October 9-24. 

Faithfully reproduced f r om 
McCall's, Ladies Home Journal, 
and Better Homes and Gardens 
by one Star Gas Company, these 
kitchens were selected as the 

Candy tastes so good 
now that cool weather 

is here! 

HAS OPERATION 
An ambulance from the Mahan 

Funeral Home took Mrs. C. R. 1  
Elliott to a Dallas hospital last 
Friday, where she underwent a 
major operation on Saturday, Re-
ports 

 
coming from the hospital; 

are to the effect that she is get-! 
ting along nicely. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. Boggs spent' 
last week end with Mr. and Mrs.' 
J. B. Walling and Mr. and Mrs. 

NOTICE 1 

I have Polio Insurance to 
cover the entire family for 
only $10 per year. 

Also covers lukemia and 
other diseases. 

yes'... HERE'S HOW  

Control the Cost of Beef 

Pork and Poultry 

II  R. M. Almanrode 
40 Be Assured of Top Quality 

Properly Aged Beef 

• Hickory Smoked, Sugar Cured 
Pork 

IT PAYS TO ADVERTISE 

VlSir our Candy Depart-
ment . . . featuring KING'S 
CHOCOLATES FOR 
AMERICAN QUEENS. 
We've just received new fall 
stocks of delicious, fresh 
chocolates . . . complete line 
of beautiful gift packages and 
new moderately priced boxes 
of quality chocolates for per-
sonal and !wing 
enjoyment..  

eial,F777PrriF.W7rTrrt777-'4[775ribra 

Chocolates 
Ask about our Candy of the 'Week! 

Two Kinds of Cold In One 
Kitchen Area--Frostair ! 

our son and brother, Alfred M.1 

Eiland's 
Drug Store 

In rder to qualify for enlist-
ment in the WAC or WAF, the most outstanding designs of the 
applicant must be between the year. 
ages of 18 and 35 with no depend- Natural birch cabinets, gay 
ents under 16 yeais of age, and snack-louges, handy snack bars, 
satisfactorily pass the mental, and practical planning desks are 
moral and physical examinations. some of the newer elements that 

Anyone possessing these quali- appear in the reproductions. 
fications and interested in becom- Each kitchen will occupy its 
ing a member of the WAC or own booth in the Natural Gas 
WAF is requested to contact her Building, with one wall cut away. Randall Walling in Wichita Falls. 
local recruiting sergeant at Has- providing fair-goers With an 1,1t1 

kell, in the court house building, obgtructed view of all feautres. l 
in order that an appointment may Pamphlets Will be available 

be arranged. 	 I about each kitchen so that inter- 
ested Fair visitors can carry home 

CARD OF THANKS 	! floor plans and descriptions of 
in-

We want to thank our many, corporated into their own 
the features which may be 

build-
friends for their kindnesses duic  
ing the return and reburial of i 

 ing or remodeling ideas. 

Mont- 
Troy. Our special gratitude goes' Kelton Tidwell, Delbert 
to the American Legion and the gomery, Gary Reid, Jr., Sappy Golle- 
ministers, also to friends for food Bowley, and Curtis Wayne 

and flowers. 	
i hon, who are stationed at Camp 

May each of you be blessed for night Texas, came in Tuesday your kindness and generosity. I night to spend a ten day furlough 

The Troy family. 
	with their parents and with 
' friends. 1tc. 

S a v e over 25 per cent by purchasing 
beef wholesale; over 35 per cent by purch- 
asing pork in wholesale quantities. Save 
over 50 per cent by raising your own beef 
_and pork and supplying your locker. 

Home Locker Owners: 

Remember to have properly processed 
meats, it must be packaged properly-  and 
quick frozen before being stored in your 
home storage locker. 

St' TIME f••• 
PSZY 19/661Y SI/OPPERS 

SPEND AS LITTLE OR AS MUCH TIME.:. 
WITH US AS YOU LIKE-- 091VOUlder 1  
CHECKOUTS SPEED YOU ON YOUR- WA 

FOODS FROZEN 

For Those Who Want The Best ! 

7 Cu. Ft. Refrigerator 

Red Perch Fryers 
Dressed, quick frozen 

1% to 21/2  lbs. 
Boneless, lb. 

Rump Roast, lb. 

Brick Chili, lb. 

45c 39c Hamburger, lb. 42c 

49c 	Dry Salt, No. 1 lb. 35c 

Catfish Steaks 
Boneless, lb. 

77c 
CRUSTINE GEBHARDT'S 

Shortening, 3 lbs. 95c Tamales, 2 cans 35c 

Chocolate Chip 
Cookies 

Box of 1 dozen 

51c 

No waste space; Frostair's cold comes from the walls. 

Room for everything at reach-in-level from tall bottles to 

plump melons. Air is always motionless, always moist. Foods 

stay garden fresh in uncovered dishes. Icemaker freezes 90 

cubes three times' an evening, or frozen delicacies. Removable 

shelves and acid-resisting porcelain interior make Frostair 

easy to clean. 

Frozen Pies 
Blueberry, Pineapple 

Cherry. 

Gebhardt's Beans with chili gravy, can 	33c 65c 
America's Only Duplex Refrigerator 

3.5 Cu. Ft. Zero Locker 

Cookie Dough 
In rolls, 24 or more, cocoa- 
nut, fudge nut, butter pe- 
can and oatmeal. 

WHITE SWAN 25c 

Frozen Rolls 
They're Delicious 

29c Coffee, lb. can 	49c 

BREEZE 
W. P. BROWN 28c 

Sand for Ringling Bros. and Barnum L Bailey 
Official 35 Piece Play Circus Brooms, each 	 1.19 

Slaughtering days are Monday, Tuesday 
and Wednesday of each week. Let us 
show you the facts! 

Quantity purchases reduce food bills as much as 20%. 

Constant zero cold keeps food frozen-fresh for months. Twin 

bins store 130 lbs. of meat, 80 qts. of fruits and vegetables. 

Frostair's Zero Locker is a deluxe frozen foodapantry—and 

it's right in your kitchen. It saves you time, steps and money. .F,OR 'FREeciqfit:Rti,,,LNIK:t 

See It On Display Here! 

SWAN 	Lg. SIZE 15o 

Sand for Ringling Bros. and Barnum & 
Official 35 Piece Play Circus 

J. L. Stodghill 
E=117,1-1_' • 

Munday 
Locker Plant 

"Your Ford Tractor Dealer" 

WON BEANS AND 

Potatoes, 2 No. 2 cans 

Tokay Grapes, 2 lbs. 

Spuds, No. 1, 10 lbs. 
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FIRST METHODIST CHURCH 

Wm. G. Barr, pastor • 
Sunday School At 10:00 A. M. 

Classes for all ages with good 
teachers. Visitors welcome. Joel 
Massey is Gen. Supt. and Earl 
McNiel is secretary. 
Morning Church At 10:55 A. M. 

The choir will sing. Mrs. Oscar , 
Spann is director, and Mrs..J. H. 
Bardwell is pianist. The sermon' 
will be by the pastor, Rev. W. Q. 
Barr. He wil speak in the subject 
of "Justification". 
Vesper Service At 6:30 P. M. 

There will be congregational 
singing and gospel preaching. 
Rev. Howard Crawford will be 
the guest speaker. He is Dist. 
Supt. of the Stainford Dist. of 
the Methodist Church. The public 
is invited. 
Youth Fellowship At 7:30 P. M. 

The three groups 'of Juniors. 
Intermediates, and Seniors will I 
meet at this hour with their res-
pective sponsors, for their wor-
ship program. Following the wor-
ship program, all groups will 
gather in the church where the 
pastor will show the special 
sound pictures for the month. The 
public is also invited to see these 
pictures. There will be no charge. 
Prayer Meeting At 9 A. M. Wed-
nesday. 

Any person interested in pray-
er and in deepening the spiritual 
life is invited to attend this ser-
vice from 9 to 10 o'clock. 

4 

Plenty Of 
Apples And 

Sweet Potatoes 

Other fruits and vegetables 
now in stock at our fruit stand. 
Come here for your needs. We 

can save you money! 

MORROW'S 

Fruit Stand 

LOCALS 
J. E. Waldron Was taken to a 

Dallas hospital for examination 
and treatment last Monday by an 
ambulance from the Mahan Fun-
eral Home. Latest reports are to 
the effect that he is improving. 

D. M. Wadlington was brought 
honie last Tuesday from the Knox 
county hospital, where he had 
been undergoing treatment. He 
is reported to be somewhat im-
proved. 

Mrs. J. B. Bowden left Sunday 
for Cisco and Albany to visit Mr. 
and Mrs. M. L. Joyce and other 
relatives. 

••..J 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bailey King 
went to Wichita Falls last Sun-
day to meet Mrs. A. E. Womble 
who returned from an extended 
visit in Woodward, Oklahoma. 

CITY DRUG STORE 

4 

Ao1416010ane 
1241""anitf9e#  

Sere is Lucien Lelong Cologne 
in a new and delightfully cooling 
form. It's,  a solid! And it can 

'neither spill nor leak. Carry 
Solid Cologne everywhere .. 
glide it over your skin on the 
spur of any moment to achieve 
a wonderfully refreshing and 
fragrant effect. 

• 

• Seven Lucien Lelong 
fragrances: Balalaika, 41  r  
Indiscrete, Jabot, Sirocco, 6"1„., 
Taglio, Tailspin, Whisper. .  

Eiland's 
Drug Store 

Get The 

Best Fr©m 

Your Flock 

This Fall! 

4 

You can do this by feeding Nutrena 
feeds, after culling off the non-layers. 
You'll find Nutrena the best in the long 
run. 

See us for Nutrena. Feed, poultry 
remedies and Colonial chicks. Bring us 
your poultry and eggs. 

Banner Produce 
Mr. and Mrs. R. T. Morrow 

4 
IC

t I 
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EGG MASH PELLETS 
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Mrs. H. D. Warren and Ma 
Young and daughter, Ruth, visit-
ed Miss Jeannette Young in Dal-
las last Wednesday. Jea mints.  is 
in a Dallas hospital undergoing 
treatment. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Reeves and 
son, Parry, spent the first of this 
week in Lubbock, visiting with 
relatives, and Mr. Reeves also at-
tended a meeting of Dodge deal- 
ers. 

a little tough if average yields 
are had from the acreage goal. 
The average yields are 71.5 mil-
lion for the U. S., and 6.5 mil-
lion for Texas. And another bum-
per wheat crop in 1949 would 
probably require marketing quot-
as for all growers in 1950. 

So, it looks like good business 
to face the facts, says Bates and 
Miller. If some marginal acres 
have been in crops that should 
be returned to pastures, better 
plan to begin re-sodding now. In-
crease your summer fallowing 
and erosion control practices, 
say these extension specialists, 
and 'plant soil-building legumes 
wherever they are needed. 

Plan ,ahead, plant wisely, and 
give your soil a break. 

	I 

1 

You're Cordially Welcome To These 

Church Services 
Knox Prairie Philosopher Says 

Russia's Latest Proposal Has Put 
Him In The World Thinker, Class 

• 
the way I fix my house, which is 
talk about how much it needs fix-
in and do nothin about it until 
the roof caves in or the back 
porch falls off, then I have to do 
something. Which goes to show 
that while I may be dumb, dumb-
ness ain't limited to the confines 
of Miller creek. There is as sort 
of international dumbness 'that 
makes me feel comfortable about 
my own. You feel all right? 

Yours' faithfully, 
J. A. 	, 

Editor's note: The Knox Prair-
ie Philosoper on his Johnson 
grass farm on Miller Creek may 
make Russia mad if he keeps up 
such letters as the following: 
Dear editar: 

I have been referred to occas-
ionally by people who maybe 
ought to know as bein dumb and 
ignorant and I don't take the 
trouble to deny it as arguin takes 
up a lot of time and effort that 
could be spent relaxin gnd besid-
es it might be true, but if I am 
dumb, I wish to say I am not by 
myself. 	 iela 

I noticed in a copy of -a Sun-
day newspaper which turned up 
out here Monday mornin where 
the Russian spokesman, Vishin-
sky, come out with a proposal be-
fore the United Nations meeting 
for everybody to reduce their 
land, sea and air force by a third, 
and for the United Nations to 
ban the atomic bomb. 

Of course, in 	 
one way, Vis-
hinsky ain't so 
dumb. If my 
wife held the 
skillet in the 
Mouse in her 
hand and was 
between me & 
the door and I 
was wantin to 
get in to town,- 
I'd be in favor 	J. A.  
of bannin the use of skillets, but 

------ 
-enaaxttrais\tVoA Coats 

Nationally known as the finest 
candy possible to manufacture. 

en 
A complete stock, packed in beautiful 
boxes is here for your selection. 

BRUSHY BAPTIST CHURCH 
The Brushy Baptist church or-

ganized a training union on Sun-
day, October 3, with 34 members. 
The general officers are: 

Mrs. J. H. Skiles, director; 
Mrs. Carl Conwell, associate dir-
ector; Miss Lettitia Cooke, secre-
tary; Robert T. Cooke, chorister; 
Mrs. Walter Rutherford, pianist; 
G. W. McGee, intermediate direc-
tor; Mrs. Lynn Cooke, union dir-
ector, and Mrs. Kenneth John-
son, primary director. 

Wheat Situation 
Is Reviewed By 

A&M Specialist 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Huron A. Polnac, pastor 

Sunday school, 10 a. m.; morn-
ing worship, 11 a. m.; training 
union, 6:45 p. m.; evening wor-
ship, 7:45 p. m.; mid-week serv-
ice, 7:30 p. m. 

T h e singspiration m e t in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Suggs last Sunday night, with 
about 50 young people present 
This is a part of our regular Sun-
day program for the young 
people. Bobby Carolyn Bowden 
directs the music, and Shirley 
Yost plays the piano. 

,The W.M.U. has changed their 
time of meeting to 3 p. m. The 
next meeting will be at the cliiirch 
next Monday for the rural service 
program. The Sunbeams also 
meet at 3 p. m. Monday afternoon. 

Sunday was enrollment day at 
Sunday school. 206 enrolled. The 

What's ahead for wheat, ask 
Texas farmers. Here's the an-
swer. Facts and figures in the 
government wheat outlook sound 
a note of caution. Now that fall 
seeding is under way, here are 
the facts as they are seen by E. A. 
Miller, extension agronomist, and 
C. H. Bates, extension farm man-
agement' specialist of Texas A.& 
M. College. 

Here's -what the wheat grow-
ers like. The continued strong de-
mand here in this country should 
take up 750 million bushels of 
this year's big crop. This would 
mean wily 20 million bushels less 
than what we used last year. The 
European Recovery Program will 

first officers and teachers meet- 	 use around 450 million bushels. 
where Vinshinsky falls flat is in 

ing-  had a good start last Wednes- The wheat price support for the 
believing anybody is gonna take 

day evening. There was only one 

	

	 w„ 1949 crop is 90 percent of parity 
his advice, especially his 

Vneral officer anti one teacher , 

	

	 on—  through loan and purchase agree- 
country, 

absent, and this because of ill- 	 ments. 	 ). 4a; till 
I guess if every 

ness in the home. Six depart- For example, 
nation

And here are a few gloomy 

ments were 100 per cent. Sup. 
	reduced Its araments by facts. The carry-over of wheat 

onethird, everybody would still be 
Niel \ Brown and associate supt. 	 stocks next July 1, is expected to 

relatively as safe or unsafe as 
Winston Blacklock plan to or- 	 be up nearly one-fifth above the 

they was before, but it wouldn't prewar level. European wheat 
be no trouble at all for the Russ- production has improved, and 
ians to send out a report on how will approach the yields they had 
much she has reduced, but any- before the war, if they don't get 

NOTICE 
We have a few more 4-wheel 

trailers left ! 
• 

e 

f 

ganize a new adult class next 
Sunday for young married coup-
les. 

. . . with 600x16 Firestone passenger 
tires; with combination grain box , bed 
with cotton frames for 2-bale job. 

these are painted inside and out. All 
new and priced to move. Bible doctrines are being studi-

ed Wednesday evenings. The at-1  
tendance has been good, but oth-
ers are urged to attend. 

0. V. 11111STEAD WELDING 

And MACHINE SHOP 

CHURCH OF GOD 
Everyone is cordially invited to 

attend services at the Church of 
God. Young people's endeavor, 
Thursday at 8 p. m.; regular ser-
vices Saturday evening, 8 p. m.; 
Sunday school at 10 p. m.; sermon 
at 11. Evangelistic service Sun-
day evening at 8 o'clock. 

H. E. Weatherby, pastor. 

UNION CHAPEL CHURCH 
There will be services at the 

Union Chapel Methodist church 
Sunday afternoon, October 10, at 
three-thirty. Everyone is invited 
to attend. 

Rev. Bernard F. Seay, pastor. 

, • 

a stack of bad weather. The 
United States acreage goal has 
been set 8 percent below last 
year's goal, and Texas' recom-
mended seeding goal is down 10 
percent. The storage bins are 
heavily loaded with this year's 
big wheat, grain sorghum and 

' corn crops. 
All in all, it looks like the 

United States and world supplies 
have improved quite a bit. Next 
year's carry-over certainly will be 
up, and the situation could look 

body who believed her would be 
dumber than I am, 

Russia reducin araments is 
about like this country reducin 
taxes. It -just ain't likely to hap-
pen. 

Personally, I don't know what 
to do about the Russian situation, 
but suppose we'll handle it 'like 
we have all the other situations, 
which is talk about it and do 
nothin until we're forced to, 
which is generally a few years 
too late. Which reminds me of 

Used Tires Strickland 

Radio Service 
® Crosley Ranges 

® Crosley Refrigerators 

• Crosley Radios 

• Cros!ey Frostmasters. 

New 949 Crosley radio now on dis- 
play. We have a radio to fit every 
purse ! 

ti 

Mr. and Mrs. P. V. Williams 
are spending several weeks on 
the coast. 

We have a stock of good used tires, principally 600x16, 
and a few odd sizes, good for trailer tires, going at . . . 

$1.00 Up  

600x16 rims, good for implement rims, priced 
	 $2.75 

Mrs. Richard Kunkle of Megar-
gel was a business visitor in Mun-
day last Tuesday. 

et,  
RELIEF AT ST 
ForYour CO GH 
Creomulsion relieves promptly; because 
it goes right to the seat of the trouble 
to help loosen and expel germ laden 
phlegm and aid nature to soothe and 
heal raw, tender, inflamed bronchial 
mucous mecnbranes.Tell your druggist 
to sell you a bottle of Creomulsion 
with the understanding you must like 
the way it quickly allays the cough 
or you are to have your money back. 

CREOMULSION 
for Coughs,Chest Colds, Bronchitis 

at only ___ 

Gates V-Belts, fractional h. p. belts, and refrigerator 
belts. See our stock! 

Battery Special 
Group 1 Batteries, only   $10.95 

(Others at corresponding prices) 

GET YOUR HEATERS FOR WINTER ! 

One lot of bathroom heaters, while they last, 
for only 	 $5.00 

Space Heaters, natural gas  	$7.50 

You'll find these and many other needs at our store. 
Come in and look around! 

or 
a 
7 	 ti  
°

i  6  els   4:  
Pacific e,,  

‘.n TIRES 4' 
A 	ge 

uto Tire & 
Supply Co. 

John C Halt 

Griffith Oil Co. 
la acomprein 

Phone 304-J 

iiii
1 GUARDS YOU FROM tOSS 

DUI TO TIRE FAIEURE
t-  

ASSURED MILEA.GE iniwzaries 	clwitlice 
, --,.,  it.  c.,., ,... 	,.- ..,   	,t.  

A. A. Smith, Jr. 
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Bring Your Car Here For . 	. 

Quick Service 
* On Washing and Greasing. 

• On Polishing Jobs, with car 
vacuum cleaned. 

• On motor tune-ups or overhaul 
jobs 

• On minor repairs or adjustments. 

Let us check your wheel alignment 
with our new Bear Machine. Adjustment 
accurately made. No guesswork ! 

Munday Truck Cl 

Tractor Co. 

The Farmall House Chrysler-Plymouth 

Let Us Help You Cure 
Your Money Troubles ! 

Want better records for tax purposes? 
Start a checking account. Worried about 
the safety of your money? Don't hoard, 
deposit it here. 

Want to save time paying bills? Pay 
by check. Want money for personal 
needs? Borrow at this bank. 

Need cash in your business? See us 
about a loan. Have other financial troub- 
les? Discuss them with us. 

The First National Bank 
IN MUNDAY 

Member Depositor's Insurance Corporation 
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FOR SALE-1947 Chevrolet club I 
coupe, 1936 tudoor Chevrolet, 
1947 Chevrolet fordoor sedan; 
1947 Ford sedan; and 1946 
Dodge pickup, %-ton. Leon 
Reagan Used Car lot, north of 
City Hall, Munday, Texas. 

10-tfc. 

Buy, Sell, Rent, Lease or Exchange It Through . . . 
SOMETHING NEW-In a water 

pressure system. Everything 
you want in a pump. Come by 
and look at the Robbins and 
Myers pump. Strickland Radio 
Service. 	 9-tfc. 

Batteries Auto Loans 
• Financing 
• Refinancing 

• Insurance 
The Times Want Ads  SEE THE-New Air-Way Saniti-

zor. The most complete health 
and house cleaning unit. Write 
or phone G. L. Forester, Sr., 
Seymour, Texas, for free dem- 
onstration. 	 11-4tp. 

a 

We will allow you $3.75 credit 
for your old battery on any 
new battery in our stock, or 
we will pay you $2.85 cash for 
your old batteries. Any num- 

ber. • 

KRAUSE PLOWS--We can make 
immediate delivery on 8, 10, 12, 
and 15 foot Krause plows. Mon-
day Truck & Tractor Co. 32-tfc. 

THE IDEAL-System of business 
and tax records. Handy for 
keeping complete record of busi-
ness. We have them for farm 
and ranch, beauty and barber 
shops, cafes and restaurants, 
garages and service stations, 
and general business. The Mun- 
day Times. 	 28-itfc. 

FOR SALE-12 guage pump ac-
tion shot gun. See Gerry Allen, 
Goree, Texas. 	11-2tp. 

Friendly, Courteous Service 

Office Hours: 8:00 to 6:30 

FOR SALE 	Certified West Star 
seed wheat, with blue tag. 
Houston Sweatt, % mile east of 
sales barn. Phone 913F-2 rings. 

10-2tp. 

7 YOU N E E D-Money on your 
farm or ranch at low interest 
rates, see me. C. L. Mayes, in 
First National Bank building. 

48-tfc. SCRATCH P A D S-Bound and 
perforated. Ideal for figuring. 
Ten cents each.-  The Munday 
Times. 	 36-tfc. Munday Auto Co. CASTERS-2-Inch wheel rollers 

for office chairs and home fur-
niture. Roll easily and silently. 
Now stocked at The Times Of- 
fice. 	 20-tfc 

STOP QUICK-A split second may 
make the difference between life 
and death. Let us make your car 
safe with our new Bear System 
service. Monday Truck & Tractor 
Ca 	 5-tor 

Phone 274 
Lanier 

Finance Co. 
FOR SALE-Moline grain drill, 

in good condition. Harrell's 
Hardware and Furniture. 1te. 

BATTERIES-Let us Install a i 
new battery in your car before 
they get so high and scarce. 
Blacklock Home & Auto Supply. 

3-tic. 
4 	  
WANTED-Clean cotton rags. 

No silk or khaki, please. Will 
pay 1211' cents per pound. 
Munday Truck & Tractor Co., 
Munday, Texas. 	9-tfc. 

USED TIRES-We have lots of 
good used tires, priced r i g h t. 
Blacklock Home & Auto Supply. 

2-tfc. 
W. E. Benedict, Mgr. 

Phone 3161 	Knox City KRAUSE PLOWS-We can make 
immediete delivery on 8, 10, 12, 
and 15 foot Krause plows. Mun-
day Truck & Tractor Co. 32-tic. 

John Hancock Farm 
And -Ranch Loans! FOR SALE-MM tractor univer 

sal -Z with 2-row equipment. M. 
A. Bratcher, Phone 6, Seymour, 
Texas. 	 9-3tp. 

FOR SALE-4 room dwelling, good 
location for $2100.00. J. C. 
Borden Agency, First National 
Bank-  • Bldg.; Munday, Texas. 

8-tfc. 

• 4 Per Cent Interest 

• No Inspection Fees 

• Liberal Options 

INNERSPRING MATTRESSES-
We are now aole to rrn all orders 
for inner spring mattresses. 
There's none better at any price. 
Also plenty of ticking in stock 
for any kind of mattress you 
need. Home Furniture Co. & 
Mattress Factory. 	2-tfc. 

J. C. Borden 

EILECTROLUX - Vacuum clean-
ers pike $69.50. For free dem-
onstrations, sales, service and 
supplies, see or write W. H. 
McDonald, Farmers National 
Bank bldg. Box 668 Seymour, 
Texas. 	 22-tfc. 

YES, SIR-We now have -a stock 
of Gulf Tires! Come in and see 
what a real tire the Gulf is, then 
try one on your car! We can also 
supply you with automobile ac-
cessories, or give you a good 
washing and greasing job on 
your car. Continue to use Good 
Gulf products. They won't let 
you down. R. B. Bowden Gulf 
Station. 

FOR SALE-Good used gas, oil 
and electric ranges. 	Also used 
Bendix automatic washer for 
sale. West Texas Utilities Co. 

8-4tc. FOR SALE-1948 F armall M 
tractor. Used less than 30 days. 
Good as new. Munday Truck and 
Tractor Co. 	 52-tfc_ 

PAY US-By the week or month. 
It is easy to own a new washing 
machine or radio this Way. 
Blacklock Home & Auto Supply. 

2-tfc. 

NOW-That we have regular FM 
broadcasts, come by for a dem 
onstration of the famous Cros-
ley radios with FM band. Strick- 
land Radio Service. 	28-tfc. SEE US-For used cars, priced 

right. We try to trade. Broach 
Equipment. 	 11-tfc. 

FOR SALE-One five-short burn- 
er Nesco oil cook stove. 	Also 
one Florence oil heater with 
brown enamel cabinet. Both in 
good condition. See Mrs. W. F. 
Hutchenson, 2nd. house north of 
high school bldg. or L. C. Giunn, 
Jr. at •Guinn Tin Shop. 	6-tfc. 

SILVERWARE-We have Ice tea 
spoons in all patterns of 1847 

Rogers silverware. 	Richmond 
Jewelry. 	 6-tfc. 

NOW IN STOCK-Speedball sets, 
Esterbrook fountain pens, Scrip-
to pencils, Columbia arch files, 
thumb tacks, paper punches, etc. 
See our line of office supplies. 
The Munday Times. 	13-tfc 

AVOID DANGER- Th a t results 
from improper wheel alignment 
and poor brakes. We can fix 
your car with our new Bear 
machine. Munday Truck & 
Tractor Co. 	 5-tfc. 

BATTERIES-Let us install a 
new battery in your car before 
they get so high and scarce. 
Blacklock Home & Auto Supply. 

3-tic. 

ADDING MACHINE - Paper. 
Good stock nosy on hand at The 
Times Office. 	 20tfc 

NOTICE-I do service work on all 
makes of tractors and all work 
guaranteed. Call me for infor-
mation concerning new and used 
tractors and combines. Farmers 
Implement Co., 113 Ave. D., 
Haggard H. Harrison, owner 
and operator, Box 368, Burk- 
burnett, Texas, 	29-5tp.-tfc. 

MUNDAY 
IFet A 4,, 

f HE  

Or  Hi ‘'ite  
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FARMALL HOUSE 
PHONE 61 

NOI.D PROPERTY?-When in 
need of farms, or city property 
in Goree, see J. B. Justice, Goree, 
Texas. 	 42-tic. 

SEE US-For used cars, priced 
right. We try to trade. Broach 
Equipment. 	 11-tfc. FOR SALE--Two lets, 125 feet, on 

pavement. 	Located on fourth 
block south of high school build- 
ing. G. C. Conwell. 	7-tfc. 

SEE IT TODAY I 
New 8-foot International 

Harvester electric refrigerator 
now on display! 

WE HAVE-Practically all pat-
terns in 1847 Rogers and Com-
muity silverware. Also open 
stock on Gorham sterling. Rich- 
mond's Jewelry. 	7-tfc. 

rudentiat ;jeep FOR SALE-Int-  crnati.mal tru:k 
with new pa!st job. Rea•sy to go 
at a bargain. 	Can be teen at 
Wilde's Garage in Munday. 6-tfc. 

Used Equipment 
We have a few used Interna- 

tional and John Deere 6-foot 
onevraya. 

Two 1947 model Farmall M 
tractors. 

One 1.947 John Deere G. M. 
4-row tractor with all equip-
ment. 

CAN GIVE YOU., 
HANDY-HOT - Washer, the 

washer for small clothing, or 
the small family. See them at 
Reid's Hardware. 	39-tfc. 

FARM 
LOANS I HAVE-Two registered short 

horn male calves. 	A. K. Mc- 
Gaughey, Vera, Texas. 	8-4tp. 

'1114••::73.1‘• 
sta.rjug g;.the power of the Willys-

0 verland "Jeep" Engine plus 
the pull of 4-wheel traction, 
which makes this one vehicle 
serve you as a light tractor, a 
truck, a runabout and a mo-
bile power unit-spreading 
its cost over many a Obi 

KRAUSE PLOWS-We can make 
immediate delivery on 8, 10, 12, 
and 15 foot Krause plows. Mun-
day Truck & Tractor Co. 32-tic. 

I Low Interest 

j Long Term 

✓ Fair Appraisal 

j Prompt Servics 
SEE US-For used cars, priced 

right. We try to trade. Broach 
Equipment. 	 11-tic. 

FOR SALE-One new 4-room 
modern house, all built in feat-
tires, including built in bath tub, 
standard planting equipment, 
20-gallon Crane automatic water 
heater, etc. For quick sale, 
priced to sell, to be moved. 0. V. 
Milstead. 	 8-tfc. Auto Tire And 

Supply Co. J. C. Harpham 
John Hart 

FOR. SALE-480 acre place in 
Patales, New Mexico. 4-room 
stucco house, big barn. 160 
acres in cultivation. Six miles 
south of Patales. L. C. Frank-
lin, Rt. 2, Munday, Texas. 9-2tp. 

A. A. Smith, Jr. 

FOR SALE-New 1948 1-ton Fora 
truck, with heavy transmission 
in rear end, rated same as 1% 
ton job. Large radiator. 700x18 
8 ply tires, dual wheels, made 
August 26, 1948. 90 day service 
policy good at any authorized 
Ford dealer. Priced to sell. 0. V. 
Milstead, Munday, Texas. 8-tfc. 

1948 Gleaner-Baldwin 12-foot 
combine. 

1947 Gleaner-Baldwin 21-foot 
combine. 

1947 KBS International truck 
with grain bed. Has 2-speed 
rear end and 8:25 tires. 

1947 3S-ton Chevrolet pickup 
with 4-speed transmission. 

1942 Ford club coupe with 
white sidewall tires. 

Radios and Heaters 

Let us install a Mo-Par radio 
or heater in your Chrysler or 
Plymouth autcanobile. 

Insurance, Real Estate 
And Loans 

blUNDAY, TEXAS 

Authorized Mortgage Loan So- 
licitor For The Prudential In- 
surance Company of America. Come Here For All Kinds 

Of Fencing Needs 
We have a supply of fencing needs for 

the home, the field, the poultry and other 
uses. 

FOR SALE-2-ton Chevrolet truck 
with new motor and good tires. 
Also 6x8 dump bed in good con-
dition. Will sell with or without 
bed. M. H. Brumley at Farmers 
Coop Gin. 	 7-4tc. 

INNERSPRING MATTRESSES-
We are now able to fill all orders 
for inner spring mattresses. 
There's none better at any price. 
Also plenty of ticking in stock 
for any kind of mattress you 
need. Home Furniture Co. & 
Mattress Factory. 	2-tfc. 

WANTED-Clean cotton rags. 
No silk or khaki, please. Will 
pay 12% cents per pound. 
Munday Truck & Tractor Co., 
Munday, Texas. 	9-tfc. 

Navy Oil 
35 cents per gallon in barrel 

lots-barreil free! 
One Norge 8-foot refriger- 

ator. 	 • 

LET'S TRADE BATTERIES 

Your old battery is worth 
$3.50 on a new Auto- Lite or 
Goodrich quality battery. 

I HAVE-Good clean early black 
hull wheat. Test 61", Germina-
tion 91%. Three miles west of 
Westover, Texas. Leo Knezek. 

7-6tp. 

FOR SALE-Mixed and sandy 
land farm, 137 acres, 3% miles 
east of Munday. A real good 
little farm. See D. E. Holder, 
Munday, Texas. 	10-4tc. 

See us for your needs in field fence, 
barbed wire, poultry netting, cedar posts, 
steel posts, etc. FOR SALE--Early blackball seed 

w h e u t, exceptionally pure. 96 
per cent germination. $2.50 per 
bushel. Ernest Knezek, route 2, 
Seymour. 6 miles southwest of 
town. 	 7-6tp. Munday Lumber Co. 

FOR GIFTS-For every occas-
sion and fresh cut flowers, 
corsages and funeral work, 
come to the Knbx City Flower 
and Gift Shop. Phone 2162. 
Prompt delivery in Knox City 
vicinity. 10-4tc. 

MAKE SURE-You can steer sure 
enough. Get a Bear wheel align-
ment check-up today! Munday 
Truck & Tractor Co. 	5-tfc. 

General Electric Dealer 

NOW OPEN= My gravel pit at 
Rule. Have plenty of gravel 
and sand for sale. Lee Corzine, 
Rule, Texas. 	 9Atp. 

FOR SALE OR LEASE - My 
Beauty Shop. Cheap rent, good 
equipment, reason for selling, 
other business. See my father 
for information. Sell cheap. 
Hyder Blackburn, Red Springs, 
Texas. 	 9-3tp, 

BUY STOVES NOW . . . 

FOR WINTER 
STRAYED-Half breed jersey he-

ifer, brown and white face. We- 
ight about 500 lbs. 	Missing 
about 60 days. Will give $10 re-
ward. Lloyd Bradley, Goree, Tex- 
as. 	 7-4tp. 

FARM MACHINERY-Available 
now. New Ferguson tractors and 
implements at list price. No 
dealers. Rule Tractor Co., tele-
phone 71, Rule, Texas. 44-tfc 

NOTICE-Bring us your radios. 
Expert repairmen will fix it up 
for you promptly. Melvin Strick- 
land Radio Shop. 	43-tfc. 

FOR SALE--•_-ne used table-top 
oil cook stove; also one used ice 

FOR SALE-3-room building. Re- box. Strickland's Radio Service. 4-tfc. 
painted and in good condition. 	   FOR SALE 

Believe It Or Not ! 

Get Them Below Cost ! 
Only two heavy duty, 5-ton trailers 

going now at . . . . 

$20. Below Our Cost ! 
You'll have to see these trailers to 

appreciate them. 

C. J. Stengel, 4 miles west of 
Rhineland. 	 10-3tp. 

iOR SALE-Model 44 Ford tract-1  
or with equipment. W. T. 
Sparks, 3 miles northwest of 
Sunset 	 10-4tp. 

JOR SALE-'41 model Vital-Air 
ice box. 75 lbs. Arnold Land, 
Goree, Texas. 	10-3tp. 

FOR SALE-11-room house and 
bath for sale. 	Across street 
west of hospital. 	See H. C. 
Pennington, Knox City, Texas. 

10-2tp. 

That BOY or GIRL going to 
SCHOOL 

FOR SALE-G. 
all sizes from 
up. 1/4 h. p., 
Price $16.35. 
1750 rpm. $22 

E. electric motors, 
fractional h. p. Qn 
110 v. 1750 rpm. 

1/3 h. p., 110 v., 
.50. 0. V. Milstead. 

8-tfc. 

We have received our fall shipment of 
heaters-b o t h natural gas and butane 
gas. Come in and see them. 

When you need a radio, come in and 
look over our stock. We have radios and 
combination sets. 

• Also Disposals and steel kitchen cabi- 
nets. 

Now have one good used washing ma- 
chine, to go at a bargain. 

FOR SCHOOL-Genuine leather 
zipper notebook ring binders, 
$3.00 each at The Munday Times. 

4-tfc. 

FOR SALE-4-room dwelling, good 
location for $2100.00. J. C. 
Borden Agency, First National 
Bank Bldg., Munday, Texas. 

8-tic. 

For only a NICKLE a day 

I can insure them against acci-
dents which will pay: 
Bills for treatment and care of 

injuries 
up to $500.00 each accident 

AND IN ADDITION 
$75.00 to $5000.00 for loss of 

Finger to loss of Sight. 

AND 
Considerable sums for complete 
fracture of bones; Complete dis-
locations of joints; Loss by re-
moval. 

LET US-give you wheel align-
ment service with our new Bear 
machine. Makes driving safer! 
Munday Truck & Tractor Co. 

5-tfc. 

WANT TO RENT-Unfurnished 
house in Munday. References 
furnished_ Permanent. Phone 
311-J. 	

11-tfc., 
Stanley Wardlaw 

Appliance Co; 
J. L. Stodghill WANT TO MAKE-Dresses for 

girls. Any size. Complete with 
machine button holes. Mrs. M. 
Boggs. 	 11-2tc. 

FOR SALE-N e w 12-A John 
Deere 6 - foot combine with 
motor. Harrell's Hardware and 

- Furniture. 	 lte 

"Your Ford Tractor Dealer" 
J. C. HARPHAM 

Insurance Agency 
Loans & Real Estate 

Monday 	 Knox City 

SEE MUNCIE 

for 160 acres land. 80 bu. wheat; 
2, $200 cows, 1 wheat drill, 4 cub' 
tivators, and 2 wagons. All for 
$75 an acre. Also 4 houses in, 
Monday. R. M. Almanrode. 10-2te. 
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Mr. and Mrs. Jack Moore and 
John visited with relatives in Mc. 
Camey last week end.' 

Mrs. Herbert Peek and sons of 
Fort Worth visited in the home 
of T. J. Peeks' last Saturday and 
Sunday. 

Miss Nancy Bowman, who is 
attending Hardin-Simmons Uni-
versity in Abilene, spent the week 
end with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Vester Bowman. 

Mr. and Mrs. Forrest G. Daniell 

QUICK RELIEF FROM 
Symptoms of Distress Arising from 

ULCERS 
DUE TO EXCESS ACID 
Free BookTellsoftlomeTreattnentthal 
Must Help or It Will Cost You Nothing 
Over three million bottles of the Wins= 
TREATMENT have boon sold for relief 01 
symptoms of distress arising from Stomach 
and Duodenal Ulcers duo to Excess Acid—
Poor Digestion, Sour or Upset Stomach, 
Gassiness, Heartburn, Sleeplessness, etc., 
duo to Excess Acid. Sold on 15 days' trial 
Ask for "Willard's Message" which fully 
explains this treatment—free—apt 

CITY DRUG STORE 
TINER DRUG STORE 

THE REXALL STORE 

Now In Stock 
New International Grain Drill with 16 

8-inch drops. 

Used International Grain Drill with 16 
8-inch drops. 

One new oneway 6-foot plow. 

• 

Friday, October 8th 

Monte Hale and Adrian 
Booth in . . . 

Be Sure Your Car . 

Steers Right 

Come in, let us check yout car with 
our new Bear machine. We'll stop 
that Wheel shimmy, adjust wheel 
alignment and correct other ills with- 
out guesswork. 

"Along The 
Oregon Trail" i   

ALSO SERIAL AND SHORTS 

Saturday Night 

October 9th 

Stan Laurel and Oliver 
Hardy in . . . 

"Way Out West" 

COMPLETE DRUG STORE IN KNOX COUNTY 

MUNDAY, TEXAS 
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Goree News Items They returned home Wednesday ' 

Qta Mrs. Mildred Goode of. Wichita 
Falls spent Sunday visiting her 
son, -Sterling Doug Goode and 
Miss Burniece Goode. 

Mr. and Mrs. Claude Vance' 

went to Fort Worth Tuesday tot. R. L. Cook, who spent several 
attend a Dixie Series ball game. I days in a Wichita hospital, has 
	  returned home. 

Hughes-Dayton Implement Co, 

Sales—j. I. Case Service 

Rev. E. L. Naugle, pastor of th• 
First Methodist Church, G o re e, 
went to Denton last week to be 
with his wife at the bedside of 
her mother, Mrs. John Clifford, 
who had been critically ill for 
some time. Mrs. Grifford passed 
away Sunday and the funeral ser-
vices and burial were held Mon-
day in Whitesboro. 

Mrs.' Gene Heard of Houston is 
visiting Mrs. W. S. Heard and 
other relatives here this week. 

Mrs. Ray Overton of Haskell 
visited her sister, Mrs. F. Tr•John-
son Tuesday. 

GOREE 

THE A THE 
the' 

Medicine • 

• 
ed and hazardous mid-air feats of 
Les Mnds, famous aerial gym-
nast. Art Linkletter will originate 
his nationwide daily "House Par-
ty" broadcasts from Fair Park 
auditorium the week of October 
11. These attractions and many 

A Vital 

Product For 

Your Health ! 

U. S. Yates, Taylor Allen, Mrs. 
Hill Allen and a sister spent part 

rof last week in Paris, Texas visit- 
ing. 

Rhoades Allen, who is attend. 
ing Texas Tech,. Lubbock, spent 
last week end with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Hill Allen. 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Coffman of 
Lubbock visited relatives in Go-
ree last week enroute home from 
Mineral Wells. 

Mr. and Mrs. Reuben Warsham 
of Fort Worth spent part of Tues-
day in Goree greeting old friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Staivart trapeze and rings 125 feet in air, 
were Wichita Falls visitors Tues- will give their sky ballet twice 
day. 	 daily, followed by the unparallel- 

Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Jones and 
family of San Angelo spent Sat-
urday and Sunday with his sis-
ter, Mrs. Dorse Rogers. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Murdock 
were Wichita Falls visitors Mon-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Howard other broadcasts will be free. 
and Jenny Lou visited their In the Auditorium Jimmy Dur-
daughter, Mrs. Fred Gibson of ante and Harry James will head 
Lubbock recently. 	 an all-star revue. At the Grand- 

W. F. Coffman of Fort Worth stand will be the "Flying L" Rod-
visited his father, W. W. Coffman eo with Jimmy Wakely, cowboy 
last week. . 	 !singing star. The Ice Arena will 

Mrs. J. C. Newsom has return-, contain the third, all-new edition 
ed to her home with her daugh- of "Ice Cycles of 1948." 
ter, Mrs. Clyde Warren after vis-! Eleven special shows and new 
iting another laughter in Wich- thrill rides, including the compli-! 

4.  

isr 

INTERESTING SHORTS 

Sunday and Monday 

October 19-11 

"Sitting Pretty" 
Starring R o b e r t Young, 

Maureen O'Hara and Clifton 
Webb. 

We Do Repair Work 
On All Makes Of Cars ! 

No matter what ,make your car is. 
or how old it is, our medhanics can 
give you expert repair work, from a 
minor adjustment, to a major over- 
haul. 

Bring your car in now for a winter 
checkup. Have it put in tip-top shape 
before cold weather. 

Try our washing- and greasing and 
polishing service. We give a 'one-stop, 
bumper-to-bumper service. 

d  

it 10  11 f 

	

a a s or a ew days. 	sated new double ferris wheel, 
I  will dot the Midway, the greatest 
number of such attractions ever 
assembled in Texas. 

Major exhibits will include the 
South's largest automobile show, 
a revolutionary argiculture show, 
junior and senior livestock shows 
with a premium list of $62,291, 
Palomino and Quarter Horse 
shows, $100,000 electric show in-
cluding television, textile, culi; 
nary and antiques show, and a 
spectacular State Fair art exhib- 
it. 

A mile-long parade through 
/Dallas, headed By Gov. Beauford 
Jester, will precede the formal 
opening. The Governor will be 
principal speaker Saturday at the 

ceremonies for the mcirton. 	 • 	new $800 000 

The Bible says: "The Lord hath created 
medicines out of the earth; and he that is 
wise will not abhor them." 

It is our sincere wish at The Rexall 
Store that you stay well. If you do need 
medicine, however, we promise to fill 
your prescription with accuracy and 
speed. 

 Automobile , Avia. 
non and Recreation Building. 

• part of the Fair's $3,000,000 "new 
look " 

MUNDAY TRU  
The heated Texas-Oklahoma 

football game will give the reno-
vated and enlarged 67,435-seat 
Cotton Bowl its baptism of fir,' 
on opening day. 

ALSO SHORT SUBJECTS 

Tuesday, Wednesday, 

Thursday, October 12-13.14 

"Fort Apache" 
With John Wayne, Henry 

Fonda, Shirley Temple and 
J ohn Agar. 

SHORT SUBJECTS ADDED 

"The Farman House" 
Chrysler-Plymouth 

day. 
Mrs. Austin Hale, Benjamin 
Miss Mozell Corley, Knox C 
Mrs. B. G. Johnston, O'Brien 
Betty Jimnez, O'Brien. 
W. H. Day, O'Brien. 
Alfredo Hassinille, Rocheste 
A. G. Ilseng, 
Mrs. Gerald Harris, Rochest 
J. L. George, Aspermont. 
Lewis Cole, Munday. 
Mrs. Raymond Hi n z e, 

Glory. 	 • 
Dorothy Ford. Dallas. 
.Th.sse Latham. Munday. 
,Mrs. L. E Holbrook, Roch 

ter. 
Mary Hayden, Munday. 
Mrs. Loyd Stephens. Knox Cit 
Mrs. J. B. Scott. Munday. 
Mrs. James Hewett, O'Brien. 
Mrs. J. H. Qualls, O'Brien. 
Mrs. Julian Josso, Rochester.. 
Mrs. J. D. Lorell, Benjamin. 
Bobby Feemster, Vera. 
Mrs. Neil Perdue, Knox City. 
Mrs. Jimmy Cook. Goree. 
Jessie Bernal, O'Brien, 
Mrs. Luke Birkenfeld, Munda 
Kenneth Brockett, Munday. 

BIRTHS: 
Mrs. Gerald Harris 
a Daughter. 
Mrs. L. E. Holbrock 
a Daughter. 
Mrs. J. H. Qualls 

ity 

r. 

er. 

Old 

es. 

TRACT® CO. 

National 
Newspaper Week-
Oct. 1 to 8 

4 free Press, 
HIE SAFEGUARD OF DEMOCRACY 

A free press ...one of our great American 
heritages. .. is the nation's bulwark against 
forces which would destroy individual 
freedoms. An informed people are a free 
people, and as long as the printed word 
conveys to all the people the basic truths 
and records of their attainments and fail-
ures, the people will remain free. 

I. 

Mr. and 
Rochester, 

Mr. and 
Rochester, 

Mr. and 
O'Brien. 

We congratulate the West Texas Press on 
their service to the cause of freedom. We 
are proud of the part which electric 
service has in making possible the indis-
pensable service newspapers render. 

4 too, work on yoar 

newspopet  

Without my help modern 
newspaper service would 
be impossible. I operate 
linotypes ... run mono-
types ... engrave plates ... 
turn the presses, make the 
teletypes click ... melt the 
metal ... and do countless 
other jobs. Yes, I am part of 
your newspaper service —
and proud of it! 

U 

I 

Mr. and Mrs. Julian Josso, Ro-
chester, 4 Daughter. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. J. Cl o we r, 
Benjamin, a Son. 

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Johns. 
ton, Henrietta, a Son. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Cook, Go-
ree, a Son. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Cook, Gilli-
land, nd, a Daughter. 

DEATHS: 
Mr. T. C. Carter, Knox City. 
. 	---------- ---- 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Duke, Mr. and 

Mrs. John Phillips and Mrs. B. A. 
Yarbrough were business visit-
ors in Wichita Falls last Monday. 
i___-----_ 

Mr. and Mrs:' Austin Caughrdn 
visited their son and daughter-in- 

' law. Mr. and Mrs. M. B. Caugh- 
ran in Lubbock several days this' 
week. 

We4Miale 

WestTexas Utilities 
cbmikuy 

p eldifmut 



Appleknocker Says: 

He can insure anything but the Great 

Beyond, so . . . . 

1 	 

You Had Better Go To Church Next 

Sunday! 

J. C. Harpham 
Insurance Loans Real Estate 

THE BEST NEWSPAPER OFFER OF THE YEAR 

ONE YEAR 
BY M AIL IN 

TEXAS AND OKLAHOMA 

YOUR CHOICE 

THE WICHITA FAL LS RECORD NEWS 
or 

THE WICHITA DAILY TIMES 

THE LATEST NEWS IN NORTHWEST 
TEXAS AND SOUTHWEST OKLAHOMA 

Send Your Subscription Today—

This Rate For A Limited Time Only 

/ 

arawsw,‘  

THE MUNDAY TIMES, THURSDAY, Ockuurac itno 

lbaromma Cinderella Shop 
FAR nt 

PROGRAM 

Film the County Agricultural Conservation Committee  

cent or more of total amount of 
bonds, mortgages, or other secur-
ities are: Grady G. Roberts, 
Wichita Falls, Texas; Fiist Nat-
ional Bank, Munday; Texas. 

4. That the average number of 
copies of each issue of this publi-
cation sold or distributed, through 
the mails or otherwise, to paid 
subscribers during the twelve 
months preceding the date shown 
above is 1725. 

Sworn to and subscribed before 
me this 4 day of October, 1948. 
(SEAL) 	 Harvey Lee. 
(My commission expires June 

Hardin Col-
spent last 

folks. 

Dwayne Russell of 
lege, Wichita Falls, 
week end with home 

tember 1 as season will permit. 
Can be applied as late as Novem-
ber 15, but the later the poorer 
the returns. 

CAUTION: Neither t h e bac-
teria that make ,the Nitrogen nor 
the Legume can be fooled—be 
sure to use the phosphate, potash 
and innoculant. If small grain is 
used in the cream, the legume 
seed can be cut half. 

PAYMENTS: The AAA will 
pay 94 cents per hundred pounds 
for the 20% phosphate under 
Winter Legumes; 85 cents per 
100 pounds for 0-14-7 used under 
legumes; 13 and 8/10 cents per 1948. 
pound for Hairy Vetch; and 51/2 	• 
cents per pound on Austrian 
Winter Peas. The AAA require-
ments for planting are: Peas 15 
lb. in rows; 30 lb. drill; 40 lb. 
hand broadcast. Vetch 8 lb. in 
rows; 15 lb. in drill; 20 lb. hand 
broadcast. 

MARKET PRICES ARE ABOVE 
FARM SUPPORT LEVELS 

port programs. 
"For most of the important 

If the housewife were paying 
prices for food at the Govern- farm commodities under the sup- port program, prices can be sup- 
ment price-support level instead ported only at 90 percent of pari- 
of the current market prices, the ty. If cattle were selling at full 
cost of living would be consider parity, the price would be 14 cents 
ably lower, B. F. Vance, Chair- 

 
yet themarket price to 

man of the State Production and a pound,   Marketing Administration Com- farmers today is around 24 cents 
' a pound. Hogs at the 90-percent- 

mittee, said today. of-parity figure would be selling 
Commenting on the charge that at 17 cents a pound, whereas the 

farm price-supports are causing market price is 27 cents a pound." 
high food prices, Mr. Vance said ACP ELECTIONS JUST AHEAD • 

Miss Billie Lou Spelce of Wich-
ita Falls visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ardelle Spelce, over the 
week end. 

that many consumers lose sight) 
of the fact that the program is 
not designed to keep prices 
"high," but rather to balance the 
farmer's income with his cost of 
operations and living. The price- 

Farmers of Texas should begin 
thinking about the committee-
men they want to administer the 
19e Agricultural Conservation 
and Price Support Programs, 
says B. F. Vance, Chairman of  

support level therefore rises or the State PMA Committee. 

Mrs. W. V. Tiner and James 
Dyke were business visitors in 
Dallas last Tuesday. 

ministering the program. If they 
are doing a good job and are do- 
ing it as well or better than any- 
one could do it, then the farmers 
in the Community and county 
should support them by turning 
out at election time and give 
them a vote of confidence. If 
the committees can be improved 
by electing someone else, then 
that should be done. 

In the words of the chairman: 
"One of the real pillars of streng-
th in the farm program is the 
elected farmer-committees. The 
way to keep this strength is for 
farmers to participate in elec-
tions and see to it that the people 
best qualified to serve as com-
mitteemen are elected. The cali-
ber of committeemen we elect this 
fall may have a lot to do with the 
future of the farm program. 
Conservation of our soil and 
water resources is vital to the 
well-being of the Nation. 	We 
must have the best committeemen 
we can get to administer this 
program, the Nation's direct ef- 

Elections for community and 
county committeemen will be 
held in most counties of Texas 
In each community of those co-
unties farmers will elect a com-
munity committee to administer 
the farm program in that com-

munity and to advise with the 
county committee in the adm in-
istration of the program in the 
county. Also at the community 
election, delegates will be elected 
to attend a county convention 
where a county committee will be 
elected. 

The chairman suggests that 
now is the time for 	m farmers of 
the State to appraise the work of 
committeemen who are now ad- 

STATEMENT OF THE OWNER-
SHIP, MANAGEMENT, CIRCU-
LATION, ETC., REQUIRED BY 

fort to asure the future food THE ACTS OF CONGRESS OF 
supply." 	 AUGUST 24, 1912, AND MARCH 

Recommendations for a more 	 3, 1933. 
flexible program which would Of The Munday Times publish-
provide even lower support have  ed weekly at Munday, Texas for 
been made by the Department of  October 1, 1948. State of Texas, 
Agricultural from time to time, County of Knox, ss. 
Mr. Vance said, and legislation r  Before me, a notary public in 

WITH WYPE 
AMAZING BRUSHLESS 

AUTO ENAMEL 

falls according to the relation-
ship between the two. 

"Prices for food and other 
things figured in the cost of liv-
ing have been steadily rising 
since 1946, "Mr. Vance points out, 
"and prices of farm products 
generally have been above the 
support level since 1942. Price-
support operations are directed 
by law and have been in effect 
for only a few products such as 
potatoes and eggs. 

"We also have a situation now 
where prices of corn and wheat 
are down to the support level 
and yet prices are still high for 
some meat animals, such as beef 
cattle, which have no price-sup- 

first•ehoice best choice in • 
"; 

41.7 • 

a Back-to-College SUIT 

NO SPRAYING — NO BRUSH 
NO MASKING -; NO STREAKS 
Give your car a mirror-like professional 
finish with Wype, the amazing auto enamel 
you apply with a powder puff! Dries dust-
free in one hour. Anyone can apply. Covers 
any color lacquer or enamel. One quart 
does complete job-2 full coats. Gives 
new life and beauty to your car, adding 
many dollars to its value. 9 popular colors. 

New looking and slick as your 

new books! Petite fitted 

jacket and skirt of velvety Bernside 

Torgeroy, by Nardis' designer—

Chaiken. Junior sizes 7-15, 

in royal, mocha, grey, green. 

Hallmark 
Auto Supply 

Polly McBeth 

and for the State and county 
aforesaid, personally appeared 
Aaron Edgar, who, having been 
duly sworn according to law, de-
poses and says that he is the 
editor-publisher of the Munday 
Times and that the following is, 
to the best of his knowledge and 
belief, a true statement of the 
ownership, management (and if 
a daily paper, the circulation), 
etc., of the aforesaid publication 
for the date shown in the above 
caption, required by the Act of 
August 24, 1912, as amended by 
the Act of March 3, 1933, embodi-
ed in section 537, Postal Laws 
and Regulations, printed on the 
reverse of this form, to wit: 

1. That the names and addres-
ses of the publisher, editor, man-
aging editor, and business man-
ager is: Aaron Edgar, Munday, 
Texas. 

2. That the owners are: Aaron 
Edgar, Munday, Texas; Grady G. 
Roberts, Wichita Falls, Texas. 

3. That the known bondholders, 
mortgagees, and other security 
holders owning or holding 1 per 

enacted this summer provides 
such a program in the future. 
For some commodities, this more 
flexible plan will become effec-
tive in 1949, and for others in 
1950. 

BEAUTY CREAM 
W. R. Morgan, County Agricul-

tural Agent of Henderson Coun-
ty is, recommending a "beauty 
cream" with which to give "Mo-
ther Earth" a beauty treatment. 
The "beauty cream" contains 
phosphate, legume seed, and in-

noculant. 
The advantages of using this 

beauty cream are: 
(1) Adds fertilizer (nitrogen) 

to the soil. 
(2) Saves the fertilizer that is 

already in the soil. 
(3) Adds humus (vegetable 

matter) to the soil. 
(4) Prevents Erosion. 
(5) Furnishes Vitamin and Pro-

tein (potash) in Winter. 
Directions for Cream Applica- 

tion: 
(1) Spread 200 to 400 pounds 

of 20(2-  phosphate or 200 pounds 
20( < Potash and 200 pounds 0-14-
7 to each acre of the face. 

(2) Mix the legume seed and 
innoculant. 

(3) Spread 20 pounds (in rows) 
or 50 pounds (broadcast) if Peas 
or 10 pounds (in rows) or 25 
pounds broadcast if Hairy Vetch,  

- is used. 
(4) Work the mixture 2 inches 

deep into the face. 
WHEN: As soon after Sep- OD GE 

Engine 	e Begins at "40 

Tedious Engine "Break-In" 
Eliminated 

No tedious "break-in" period is neces-
sary for new Dodge owners. With Dodge 
you can drive at a brisk pace right from 
the start. Dodge actually "speed-proofs" 
your engine . . . gives cylinder walls a 
protective oil-absorbing coating that 
guards against damage during the criti-
cal "break-in" miles. This process is 
exclusive with Dodge at no extra cost 

to you. 

ONLY DODGE 
"SPEED-PROOFS" ENGINES 

With this exclusive Dodge 

process you can start off 

at 40 miles per hour. 

After 250 miles, car speed 

may be increased at the 

rate of 5 miles per hour 

for each 25 miles traveled. 

At only 350 miles 'your 

engine is ready to "go". 

Stop by your Dodge Dealer and look 
over today's luxurious Dodge. Check 
the many other big advantages Dodge 
offers . . . All-Fluid Drive . . . Full-
Floating Ride . . . Chair-Height Seats 
. . . extra-roomy interiors. Then you'll 
know why owners are so enthusiastic 
about their Dodge cars . . . why Dodge 

gives most for your new-car dollar 

today. 

PRICED CAR WITH FLUID DRIVE LOWEST 

Reeves Motor Company 

Munday, Texas 



A  Prior notice from the Veterans 
Administration will be sent to 
veterans whose National Servicel  
Insurance term policies will start 
expiring on or after October 8, 
1948. 

The notice will be sent two 
months before expiration date of 
the original policies. This will 
give the, veterans time to convert 
their t e r m• insurance t o a per-
manent NSLI plan or renew their 
term insurance for an additional 
five-year period. Renewals may 
be made without a physical exam-
inaiton, but at a higher premium 
rate based on the veterans' at-
tained age at the time of renewal. 

VA stressed the fact that vet-
erans who plan to renew their 
term insurance should submit 
their renewal application, plus a 
premium payment, prior to the 
expiration date of the original 
term policy. 

More than a million and a half 
veterans were in training under 
the provisions of the GI Bill on 
September 1, 1948, VA reported. 
Over half —871,000— were study-
ing in schools and colleges, with 
267,000 enrolled for institutional 
on-farm training and 414,000 tak-
ing on-the-job. 

"Encouraging progress", espec-
ially in the development of new 
methods of diagnosis, is revealed 
in the first reports from doctors 
working with the Veterans Ad-
ministration's radio-isotope re-
search program. 

VA revealed that Leukemia 
patients are now being treated 
with radio-phosphorus in most of 
the VA hospitals having radio- 

• isotope units. Radio-iodine is be-
ing employed to treat some thy- 

IT PAYS TO ADVERTISE 

9 
provides that a commission shall 
have power to re-district if the 
legislature refuses. The commis-
sion will consist of the lieutenant 
governor, speaker of the House, 
attorney general, state comptrol-
ler and land commissioner. 

A situation whereby a man liv-
ing in one district has only one-
sixth of the voice in the making 
of the laws which he lives as a 
man somewhere else is not demo-
cracy. It is indefensible. 

Let's pass Constitutional Am-
endment 2 and change that con-
dition! 

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Reeves, Jr., 
of Lubbock visited with their 
parents here over the week end. 

7b Relieve 
Misery of 

UQUID OR TABLETS—SAME FAST RELIEF 

Do "Plate-Sores" 
Bother You ? 

If your "GUMS" itch, burn, or 
cause you discomfort, druggists 
will return money if the first bot-
tle of "LETO'S fails to satisfy. 

TINER DRUG 

all Texas*** 
\tiv204als  49a, 
the greatest 

" State Fair 
on earth 

OCT. 9-24 
* The BIGGEST and 

BEST EXHIBITS and 
ENTERTAINMENT 

* ever assembled at any State Fair 

LIVESTOCK and AGRICULTURI 

e 	
FLYING "L" RODEO Al 	JIMMIE DURANTE and 

HARRY JAMES 
Or 	FARM MACHINERY 

AUTOMOBILE SHOW 
ICE CYCLES 

* TEXTILE, CULINARY and 
A_ 	ANTIQUE SHOW 

and others Galore! 

State Fair of Texas 
DALLAS 

THE SHOW WINDOW OF THE SOUTHWEST 

Cuts a swath 5 feet wide. Timken bear-

ings and lighter weight give you less droll. 

HUTCHINSON, KANSAS 
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Mrs. Conrad Link of Texas 

Tech, Lubbock, visited with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Osrar 
Spann and other relatives and 
friends last week end. 

Ranger's Last Patrol 

batiOUSE 
Om eve; / • 

The State Constitution provides 
that, every 10 years, the State 
shall be re-districted, in accord-
ance with the new census. But 
Texas has not been re-districted 
since 1921. 

There have, of c o u r s e, been 
many changes in population in 
27 long years. The result is a sit-
uation of gross inequality. There 
are some House of Representa-
tives districts with five and six 
times as many ,people as some 
other districts. 

Nor is this unfair condition 

WHEN IN KNOX 

CITY, VISIT 

The Army Store 

TENTS — TARPAULINS 

SHOES — CLOTHING 

TOOLS 

roid diseases. 
Questions and Answers 

Q. I am a World War H veter-
an and would like to know if VA 
will pay my doctor if I go to him 
for an examination to determine 
whether I need hospital treat-
ment or domiciliary care? 

A. The government will pay 
the cost of examinations by a pri-
vate physician only if Veterans 
Administration has given the 
physician prior authority for 
such examination. 

Q. I have purchased my home 
without a G-I loan. May I secure 
a guaranteed loan to buy furni-
ture? 

A. No. 
Q. I am enrolling under the 

G-1 Bill in a college that collects 
tuition in advance. There is a 
chance that I will be forced to; 
drop out before the end of they 
semester. Must I refund any 
money to VA? 

A. You must refund the tuit-
ion that VA paid for the time 
you did not attend, or lose the 
training time covered by these, 
payments. 

Q. Is it true that I.no longer 
can reinstate my lapsed National 
Service Life Insurance policy? 

A. No. You can still reinstate! 
your policy on a "comparative 
health basis" within three months 
from the date of lapse. If your 
policy has been lapsed for more 
than three months, you will be 
required to pass a physical ex-
amination to reinstate. Necessary 
premiums must be paid. 

confined to a single part of the 
State. It has been said that South 
and West Texas are being discri-
minated against by the failure of 
the legislature to do its duty. And 
this, is true. But consider that 
there is one East Texas district 
with 109,000 and there are lots of 
districts over the State with less 
than 25,000 citizens and one with 
only 19,000. 	Contrast this one 
with a second district in East 
Texas with 127,000 inhabitants. 

Yet the district with only 19,-
000 people has the same power in 
making laws as the district with 
127,000—six times more people 
and another has 463,000, which is 
the 1940 census, and the latest 
estimate is that the district has 
grown to 754,000. It is the Lower 
Rio Grande Valley district. 

Repeatedly, the legislature has 
failed to do its duty. Now the 
people have a chance to take ac-
tion. In the November 2 general 
election, Constiutional Amend-
ment 2 will be voted on. This 
	 • 	  

PORT ARTHUR, TEX.—Former 
Texas Ranger Stirling 0. "Sod" 
Durst, aged 65, makes his last 
rounds before retiring as a guard 
at the Gulf oil refinery here. Durst 
was commissioned a Ranger in 
1918, serving on the Texas border 
patrol. He joined the refinery 
guard f o re e immediately after 
Pearl Harbor. A protection sys-
tem, only slightly relaxed from 
that used in wartime, is still main-
tained at this refinery, country's 
largest in point of production, to 
safeguard petroleum resources so 
critical to both the national de-
fense and economy. •icskur clot 

Joseph Borden of Wichita Falls 
spent last week end here with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
Borden. Joseph is attending Hard-
in College this fall. 

Kenneth Baker and Ronald 
Foshee spent last week end with 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. P. 
Baker and Mr. and Mrs. R. E. 
Foshee. Kenneth and Ronald are 
enrolled at A&M College, College 
Station. 

2;en.4-w> 

Joseph and Abraham Salem of 
Washington, D. C., and George 
and Sam Salem spent last Sun- 
day in Lubbock visiting with Mr. 
and Mrs. Earnest Ameen. 

0. H. Spann, Jr. of McMurry 
College, Abilene, visited in the 
home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Oscar Spann last week end. 

Harry Cowan of McMurry Col-
lege, Abilene, visited his parents, 
-Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Cowan, dur-
ing the week end. 

a' 

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Clayburn of 
Marysville, Calif., came in last 
week for a visit of about ten 
days with Mr. Clayburn's mother 
and other relatives and friends. 111,11iippigi 

In a gorgeous setting inspired by 

colorful, romantic, Modern Mexico 

WOULD YOU PAY 254 
, FOR $5,000? 

That is all it costs, 250 for 
up to $5,000 protection 
for 24 hours against ac-
cidents while traveling. 
Before you go on a trip, 
see us about an /Etna Ac-
cident Ticket. See and Rear 

• • 

J. C. Harpham 
Insurance Agency 

Phone 85-J 

Attention 
Ford Tractor 

Owners ! 

• 
• 

Representing the /Etna Life Insurance 

Company of Hartford, Connecticut 

rfi1i1111111  

the small plow 
that does a 	• 4* 

man-sized job . . . 
THE NEW 

iiiWSE "9" 
DORICT•MOUNTID PlOW. 

ONE-WAY 

You can plow up to 20 acres a 
day . . . plow close to fences, 
trees, and other hard-to-get-at 
places with the new Krause "9" 
one-way. Attaches directly and 
easily to the 3-point hydraulic 
hitch on Ford and Ferguson 
tractors. Be sure to come in and 
see it today. 

NATURAL GAS BUILDING 

Look for giant flame atop Mex-
ican pink tower, high above 
State Fair of Texas Grounds! 

ENTIRE BUILDING AIR CONDITIONED 
PLENTY FREE ICE WATER 
COMFORTABLE LOUNGE 

CLEAN REST ROOMS 

KITCHENS By YOU\ GTOWN * Plus ... exhibits of latest Automatic Gas Heat-
ing Equipment 

* Silent Gas Refrigerators 

* Automatic Gas Water Heaters 

* Automatic Gas Clothes Driers 

lice Siesta Music! 

For a 

* Alfredo Casares' Mexican Orchestra with ex-
otic vocalist, Carmencita 

* Huge Mural by famous southwestern artist 

* Three colorful kitchens faithfully reproduced 
from Better Homes and Gardens, McCall's and 
Ladies Home Journal magazines 

* Wondrous all-year gas air conditioning—sum-
mer cooling ... winter heating with a flick of a 
switch! 

* Exhibit of all famous-name automatic gas 
ranges available from Southwest dealers. 

never-to- be - forgotten 

lice! 

ALFREDO CASARES ... six gay caballeros 

and exotic vocalist Carmencita will ploy 

and sing fiesta music and songs, four times 

daily in Natural Gas Building Patio: 

COMPLETE STOCK FOR MOST ANY- 
KITCHEN NOW AVAILABLE. 

SENORITA CARMENCITA CER-
BANTES - vocalist with Alfredo 
Casares Mexican Orchestra. 

Hydraulic control at your finger tips gives 

positive depth control from 1 to 6 inches. 

MADE BY 

if12 With .ga tety igt 

THE REXALL STORE 
THE MOST COMPLETE DRUG STORE IN KNOX COUNTY , 

PHONE 78 	MUNDAY, TEXAS 

1:30 p.m. 

3:30 p.m. 

5:30 p.m. 

7:30 p.m. 

LONE STAR GAS COMPANY 
"The Most Complete Drug Store In 

Knox County" A TEXAS CORPORATION 

Munday Truck 
And Tractor Co. 



macreswermarrxtrw.i.,  

J. 

• 

Sharp edged "Stop-Notches" give 
Super-Cushions extra grip for saf- 
er, quicker "stop and go" traction. 

For A Softer, Safer Ride 	Switch to 

Siglearalaan by GOO EAR 
and Ride On 24 Lbs. Of Air! 

NW \ 
• 

• — 
W 	WI WI WIN MI 	 MI 

r,;.• w 	 —  

mot Ti 	NM A 	Iwo 	• 	

You'll Save .... 

• Expense 

• Worry 

• Time 

You'll Avoid 

• Needless 
Wear 

• Additional 
Car Expense 

• Needless 
Danger 

We Give You Every 

Automotive Service 
The make of your car or the type of job 

needed doesn't make any material differ- 
ence when you bring it here for service.. 
Om' trained mechanics will do the work 
for you efficiently. 

Whether you need a small repair job, 
or a major overhaul, come in and let us' 
figure with you. Your car will get the 
service it needs, by our trained mechan- 
ics, and on scheduled time. 

REEVES MOTOR CO. 
"Your Goodyear Distributor!! 

Phone 74 	 Munday, Texas 

with a JOHN DEERE TWO-ROW 
COTTON HARVESTER 

The easiest way to boost your cotton-growing profits is to use 
a John Deere No. 15 Two-Row Cotton Harvester. Based on 1947 
labor cost, it saves $30 or more per bale over hand pulling ... 
does an excellent job in any crop that's suitable for mechanical 
stripping. 

Handling two forty-inch rows at a time, the No. 15 does a clean, 
efficient once-over job of saving bolls. Its work is considered by 
many gin operators superior to cotton stripped by the average 
hand puller. 

With the John Deese, you, too, can make short work of your 
harvest 	get all your cotton to the gin before bad weather causes 
crop losses. For details, see us the next time you're in town. 

Atkeison's 
FOOD STORE 

WHERE MOST FOLKS TRADE 

OF course you can 
afford a Af 	/ 

THE MAYTAG MASTER 
Finest Maytag ever built. 

Large, square, 
Ci115t

um  

tub 
alum`
has tra 

capacity. 

$189.95 

THE MAYTAG CHIEFTAIN. A gen-
uine Maytag, yet priced within a 
few dollars of the lowest-
cost washers on the $134.95 
market. 

111  
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Achievement Day For Farm Ownership I Times Want Ads Bring Quick Results 
Families Set October 13 At Dallas 

Rule Bobcats 
Smash Moguls 

Here Friday 
* Fall Is Here.  

Beat The Saturday Rush 

Our Vault Will Be Full Of Crispy Cold 
Fruits and Vegetables Friday Morning. 
Get Your Favorite Meat Cut Before They 
Are Picked Over. 

time the bids were in line with 
the amount of money to be spent. 
The contract was let. 

* * * * 
The new buildingewill be built, 

and with enough money left to 
equip it with the things neces-
sary for modern educational faci-
lities. 

In recognition of the achieve-
ment of perators of family-type 
farmers who have paid their 
loans and continued to operate 
their farms, the State Fair of 
Texas has designated October 13 
as "Farm Ownership Day." 

An achievement award in the 
form of a certificate will be 
awarded approximately 1400 eligi-
ble families in recognizing the ac-
complishment of the individual 
families who used improved agri-
cultural practices to produce in-
come to repay the loan advanced 
through the Farmers Home Ad-
ministration. 

The certificate is signed by 
It. L. Thornton, president of the 
State Fair of Texas, and L. J. 
Cappleman, state director of the 
Farmers H o m e Administration, 
complimenting the farmer on as-
suming a place in the ranks of 
successful Texas farm. families 
who own their homes free of 
debt. The families who have paid 
for their farms and are now liv-
ing on them in Baylor, Knox and 
Throckmorton counties are: 

Albert A. Hencirik, William J. 
Karr, Ernest R. Knezek, Chester 

* * * 

Despite the fact that they got 
the Munday Moguls showed to 
several -good breaks of the game, 
be definitely off form last Fridpd 
be definitely off form last Fric&y 
night, as the Rtile Bobcats took 
charge of three quarters of play 
to send the Moguls further in the 
cellar, 20-0. 

The Moguls came within scor-
ing distance twice during the 
game, but they lacked the punch 
and teamwork to put over a co-
unter. The line. wouldn't hold, 
and the backfield seemed to lack 
something or other. 

The Bobcats came to life in the 
second period, and they had the 
game under control from there 
out. David Hunt scored the first 
tally from the 7 yard line, after 
the Bobcats accounted for 72 
yards on straight running 'plays. 

In the third quarter, Billy Ham-
ilton crossed the goal stripe from 
the one foot line, after a pass in-
terception b y Dennis Briles. 
Briles converted for the extra 
point. 

With only a few minutes to 
play and the Moguls hopelessly 
in the deficit column, Coach 
Cloud sent in some second string-
ers to give them experience. On 
the second play Briles intercept-
ed another Mogul pass and raced 
65 yards for the final tally. . He 
again plunged over for the extra 
point. 

Rule made 7 first downs, while 
Munday accounted for 6. 

((raker !Crumbs— 
(Continued from Page One) 

thought. We voted our bonds for 
nothing. 

* * * * 

But board members kept their 
shirts on, and their heads to-
get,her. They cut out some unnec-
essary features of -the original 
plans. They shaved here and 
there. 

* * * * 

10 LB. MESH BAG 

48c 
IDAHO RUSSETS 

Spuds 
Extra Large Washington Delicious Red 

Apples 
Bell Pepper Fresh Calif. 

Work is starting right away, 
with completion slated for four 
months later. And that's what 
was happening every time you 
went to see one of those fellows 
and were told, "He's in a board 
meeting." 

* * * 
We say congratulations to 

them, but they express their ap-
preciation to the citizens and 
everyone concerned for their 
splendid spirit of cooperation. 

• * * * 
These are the type of met who 

make up our school board and 
town. And if we all practice the 
give and take and stick-to-it-ness 
that they have, Munday can get 
blamed near anything she wants! 

I.B.  

150 
Lg. tic 

QT 25c 

DOZ. 55c 

Betty, Sour Or Dill Pickles 

Eggs 

BIRTH ANNOUNCEMENT Reeves Motor Company 
Your Goodyear Distributor Fresh, Candled All Good 

I 

Mr. and 'Mrs. Bill Collander are M. Mobley and Delmer F. Styles, 
the proud parents of a baby girl, Seymour; Glen P. Owen, Bomar-
born on September 21. Both mo-1  ton; John 0. Robinson, Vera; Leo 
ther and daughter are doing fine. F. Fetch, Weldon E. Floyd, Wil-
Mrs. Collander is the former Inez I liam F. Lain, Lonnie D. Off utt, 
Prof f it t, daughter of Mr. and Frank C. Russell, Munday; Mar- 
Mrs. Jim Proffitt. 	 shall J. Gass, Goree; Tom W. 
	  Hardin, Vera; Julian C. Saunders, 

Knox City; Robert D. Bailes, Ey-
bert; Linnie L. Bellah and Milton 
C. Lee, Woodson. 

Chief speaker for the program. 
to be given in the Hall of State 

For Yea To Feel Well 	on the fair grounds at 3:30 p. m. 

week, 	::rocainni:Tkeim.efiviatz October 13, is Judge Marvin 
waste matter from the blood. 	

Jones, chief justice of the Court 
If more people were aware of how the of Claims, Washington, co-author 

kidneys must constantly remove atm, 

mat,ter that cannot sta in the blood  wof Alabama of the Bankhead- 
ith Senator John H. Bankhead plus fluid, excess acids and other waste 

Jones Farm Tenant Purchase Act 
of 1938. 

Fancy Long Shred COCOANUT 
lb. 	79c 1/2  lb. 	42c Get Your Car Ready For . 

SAFE DRIVING 
Let us correct the front end alignment 

on your car with our . . . . 

BEAR SYSTEM SERVICE 
SILVER FOAM—As Good As The Well Known Brands 

Soap Powder 	BOX 25c 
without injury to health, there would 
be better understanding of why this 
whole system is upset when kidneys fall 
to function properly. 

don sometimcs warns that something I  - 
Other features of the program Burning, scanty or too frequent newt- 

ache, headaches, dizziness, rheumatic I 
include recognition of farm own is wrong. You may sager nagging back- 

pains, getting up at nights, swelling. 	
ership c o u n t y delegations and 

Why not try Doan's Pills? You will 
be using a medicine recommended the 
country over. Doan's stimulate the func-
tion of the kidneys and help thaw to 
flush out poisonous waste from the 
blood. They contain nothing harmful. 

LB 

35c 
Cet Doan's today. Use with confidence. 
At all drug stores. 	• 

They concluded with some re-
vised plans that would give us as 
good a building, one that would 
serve just as well and as long. 

* * * * 

They sought bids again. This 

families and an address by Walt-
er Cardwell, manager Luling 
Foundation Farms and chairman 
of the state advisory committee 
of FHA. 

FINE FOR SEASONING 

Ham Hocks 
HOME KILLED BABY BEEF 

Loin or T-Bone 

Picnic Hams 

BIRTH ANNOUNCEMENT 

Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Walling of 
Wichita Fallas are proud to an-
nounce the arrival of a son, born 
Wednesday, October 6th, in a 
Wichita Falls hospital. The little 
boy weighed nine pounds and 9 
ounces. Both mother and father 
are former residence of Munday. 
The maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. M. Boggs and the 
paternal grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. R. J. Walling. 

LB. 79c 

4 To 6 LB. -AV—G. 57c 

finer 
than 

ever Mr. and Mrs. Bill Brown of 
Woodson visited with Mrs. I' 
Brown's mother, Mrs. Jo Mae 
Davis, on Wednesday. 

EVERY MEAL  

W. R. Moore was taken to a 
Wichita Falls hospital for treat-
ment the first of this week. He 
underwent an operation for a 
kidney ailment o n Thursday 
morning at eight o'clock. 

Mrs. Guy Simpson of Great 
Bend, Kans., and Mrs. Charles 
Simmons and children, Michael 
and Patricia, of San Francisco, 
Calif., spent from Thursday until 
Monday here with their sister and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Don Boyles 
and Jimmy. 

Too Late to Classilv 
FOR SALE—N e w studio couch. 

Mrs. E. E. Lowe. 	11-2tc. 

FOR SALE—Up-right threttle 
machine. Good Condition. Mrs. 
Joe Bailey 'King. 	11-1tc. 

FOR SALE—Factory built 4-
cotton sideboards. See Paul 
wheel trailer with grain bed and 
Month or Joe Decker, route 2, 
Munday. 	 ltp. 

FOR SALE-8,000 bundles hegari. 
John Phillips, Munday, Texas. 

11-2tp. 

FOR SALE-6-room house with 
bath, 3 lots, east front, one-half 
block of business district. Shade 
trees, chicken house, chicken 
fence, garage. For quick sale. 
See W. A. Short, Goree. 11-tic. 

SEE MUNCIE 
for new 5-room house and bath. 
On pavement. R. M. Almanrode. 

11-2tc. 

Now—a genuine Maytag at these easy-on-the-budget prices! 
Join the millions of women who now get real washday satis-
faction with the rugged, dependable Maytag! • 

Easy "terms. Liberal trade-in. Come in today for a dem-
onstration. 

THE MAYTAG COMMANDER 
Big, square porcelain tub. Gyra-
foam action washes 
extra fast, extra 
ele9nP 

$154.95 
DON'T FLUSH KIDNEYS 
To stop irritation and irregular 
elimination use CIT-ROS. The new 
remedy quickly restores the nor• 
mal ph. of the body fluids. The 
cause is eliminated, the body stops 
pain, heals sore spots. CIT-ROS 
brings you comforting relief. CIT-
ROS at your druggist, $1.00. For 
sale at 

CITY DRUG STORE 

HARRELL'S 
Hardware 	 Furniture 

Maytag 	 John Deere 	 RCA 
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