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Do Your Part
HKI.P KJCE1* 
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“ Everyone lntereste<l In the de­
velopment o l good livestock and 
good boys are invited to attend 
the show."

• • • •
That invitation struck us as 

being rather Interesting. It isn't 
ours, but is one which County 
Agent W. J. Bryan has placed at 
the bottom of his story on the 
junior livestock show story.

• • • •
The show will be held at Ben­

jamin next Monday, and our 
guess is that lots of people will 
be there to show their interest 
In good livestock and good boys,

• v e t
Which reminds us -  that's a 

pretty good looking bunch of 
boys we're showing wn our front 
page. • • • •

They are boys who will be 
running. Jumping, vaulting, shot 
putting, discus throwing and 
golfing for Munday High School 
down at Brownwood Friday and 
Saturday.

• • • •
Coach Leveret t is pretty proud 

of these boys, too. because* they 
are the greatest representation 
Munday has had in track and 
field events for several years. 
w • • • •

Coach said boys generally 
don't like the hard work con­
nected with track training, but 
these boys have stayed in there 
this year. • • • •

The fact that they won in the 
district meet and arc now par­
ticipating in the regional meet 
•hows that they are also doing 
their part in putting Munday on 
the map. • • • •

People in general were pretty 
well pleased with the way our 
Mogul Band "acted up” at the 
annual spring concert l a s t  
Thursday night.

• • • •
They agreed that the concert 

showed much credit for the hard 
work and practice the band mem­
bers have gone through during 
the year, and reflected much 
credit to Harold Jackson, band 
director, In his fine work with
the members.• • • •

It is generally agreed, too, 
that a town without any school 
or churches would not be a very’ 
desirable place to live, and our 
church and school acitivlties this 
year are bringing credit to our 
town. • • • •

Mr. Farmer, how's your cot­
ton acreage allotment? Do you 
have more acres allotted to you 
than you plan to use?

• • • •
We have word from the coun 

ty committee that an excess al­
lotment may be released to the 
committee, then it can be reap­
portioned to other farms in the 
county. • • • •

Such an act will help hold up 
the cotton history for the county. 
In addition to enabling other 
farmers to plant a few more 
acres. • • • •

May 4 Is the final date for re­
leasing unused acreage, so If 
you ain’t gonna use it, let some 
other fellow have it!

• • • •
Churches reported almost rec­

ord attendance at the Easter ser­
vices last Sunday, but we reckon 
we didn't get as much out of the 
preacher’s sermon as we should 
have. • • • •

It wasn’t the preacher’s fault, 
however. • • • •

You see. we went back to the 
old home town of Wellington for 
Easter, and to services at the
church we used to attend.

• • • •
We'd catch ourselves, Instead 

of following the pastor in his 
message, kinda glancing around 
to see how many people we 
knew. • • • •

It was Interesting to see those 
faces you’d see in church twen­
ty years ago. It was Interesting, 
too, to see the many new faces 
and to note ho v the personnel
of a congregation changer.• • • •

It was an Interesting sendee.

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. II. C. 
Yandell last week end were Mr 
and Mrs. Sam Gossett of Brown 
field and Mr. and Mrs. H. L. 
Yandell of Lubbock.

County Junior 
Livestock Show 
Set April 26th

4-H and F. F. A. boys from all 
parts of Knox Covjnty will com­
pete for $800.00 In prize money 
at Benjamin on Monday, April 
26th in the Annual Knox CAninty 
Jr. Livestock Show.

All entries are to be in place 
by 10:00 A. M. and the Judging 
will start at 1:00 P. M. Judges 
for the show will be Jay Hum­
phrey of Old Glory and Marvin 
Myers of Crowell.

According to W. J. Bryan, 
County Agent, entries in the 
show will include 14 head of 
beef steers, 10 head of heifers. 5 
head dairy cattle, 25 head of 
sheep, 40 head of hogs, 20 rab­
bits and 150 chickens.

Everyone Interested in the de­
velopment of good livestock and 
good boys are !?
the show.

Representing M. H. S. In Regional Track Meet

Stamford P. C. A. 
Names Officers 
For Another Year

Liquor Raids At Munday, Knox City 
Brings Arrest, Fines For 10 Persons
Munday Firemen 
Begin Campaign 
On Fire Safety

On the 20th anniversary of the 
organization of Production Cred­
it associations, J. F. McCulloch, 
of Stamford, one of the charter 
members of the Stamford asso­
ciation. was re-elected to direc­
torship at the annual meeting on 
Friday, April 16. Lasater Hens­
ley of Guthrie was also re-elected 
as a director. Each term is for 
three years. J. B. Morrison, Jr.. 
Spur, and Frank Andrews, Al­
bany, were elected to serve one 
year terms las associate (tree- 
tors.

In the re-organization of the 
board following the annual meet­
ing. C. G. Burson. Haskell, was 
re-elected president, J. F. Mc­
Culloch, vice president; J. L. 
Hill. Jr., secretary-treasurer and 
J. R. Gleaton. assistant secretary- 
treasurer.

The association serves eight 
counties of West Texas with of 
ficcs In Spur, Haskell. Anson. 
Munday and Stamford. Maria g 
ers of the field offices are. Has 
Fell. J. V. Hudson; Mund.iy, J. 
D. Gillespie; Anson. M. E. Ca- 
lothers. Beginning May 1, Boyce 
1. Williams will have charge of 
the Spur office. M. L. Rickels, 

| who has been In charge of that 
office has resigned, effective on 
that date.

In the drawing for the attend­
ance prize. Mrs. R. L. Snow of 
Peacock was awarded the tele­
vision set.

Here are the boys who left 
Thursday for Brow*nwood to rep­
resent Munday High School in 
various events of the regional 
Interscholastic League track and 
field events, having won in the

district meet.
They are: standing, left to 

right, Gary Offutt, Durwood 
Thigpen, Wayman Smith, Larry 
Lain. Jerry Scott Kenneth Pat­
terson. Terry Harrison, Joel

Smith, GaVy Cure and Buddy 
Wotnble.

Shown kneeling are Freddie 
Carom. Wyman Tidwell, Glen 
Amerson. Bennie I>*dbetter and 
Gene Haynie.

The Munday Volunteer Fire 
Department has mailed out let­
ters to residents of Munday tell­
ing about the new Co-2 tcarbon 
dioxide) fire extinguishei s lor 
the home and other uses. The 

| firemen will start Monday even- 
• ing, April 26, with samples of 
these extinguishers.

Four teams of two men will 
show complete samples to local 
iosidchts $o thev van s»*v (he ex­
tinguisher they will want to put 
in their home, car or barn. They 
are made under supervision of 
the Interstate Commerce Com- 

; mission, are non-poisonous and 
will not leave a mess to clean up 

| should they need to be used, .
Chief E. Y. Johnson says: "We 

Bremen know every home in 
Munday and every farm home 
should have one or more of these 

( extinguishers in case of e mer­
gency’. We are going to spend ev 

, V/lings during the next iw’O 
weeks to show them to you this 
safety measure is Just that lm-

Ten Knox County people, in­
cluding one candidate for sheriff 
of Knox County, were arrested
<m bootlegging charges last week

[in raids made by Knox County 
officers and nqembers of the 
Liquor Control Board.

T. O. McMinn of Knox City 
and nine othpr Knox County and 
Munday residents were included 
in the arrests.

All entered pleas of guilty be. 
fore County Judge L. A. Parker, 
who fined the 10 defendants a 
total of $3.300, plus court coats. 
McMinn was sentenced to serve 30 
days in Jail and was fined $700, 
after pleading guilty to two boot- 
legging counts. He was the only 
one to draw a Jail term. -»1

His wife, Mrs Ardene McMinn, 
pleaded guilty to five counts and 
was fined $1,000. Their 17-year- 
old son. James McMinn, was fin­
ed $200 on two counts, after' 
pleading guilty.

A Knox City negro, Nathaniel 
pleaded guilty on two 

counts and was fined $200 '  •
Defendants f  T 0 !* Munday. 

their fines, and the numbers of 
counts are:

Mack Land. $200 line. tw<  ̂
counts; Ray Reed. $100 fine, one 
count; Leroy Atkinson, $300 
fine, two counts; Stella Dabney, 
$200 fine, one count; Frank Wil­
lis, $300 fine, two counts, and

portant if anyone has been lnad- , Ezra York. $100 fine, one count.

Former Knox County Couple Make 
$300,000 Gift To Trinity University

Spring Showing 
Of Appliances To 
Be Held Tuesday

Invitations were mailed this 
week to people of the Munday 
area to attend the spring show­
ing of the 1954 Frigidaire appli­
ances at the Munday office of 
West Texas Utilities Company.

The showing will be held on 
Tuesday, April 27, from 2 to 9 
p. m., an<l a large crowd is ex- 

! ported to attend.

Mr. and Mrs. E. B. McFarlln 
of San Antonio recently present­
ed $300,000 to the building pro­
gram of Trinity University, ac­
cording to Clint C. Small, chair­
man of the board of trustees.

The memorial contribution es­
tablishes the "E. B. and Myrtle 
McFarlln Dormitory for Women, 
Trinity University,” providing 
accomodations for 150 students.

Consisting of four separate 
structures three living units and 
a lounge the dormitory Is locat­
ed In the northwest section of 
Trinity's modern 107-acre camp­
us. The gift came eight days be­
fore the university’s 85th birth­
day and represents the largest 
Individual contribution to build 
ings nl the university's history.

Mrs. McFarlln. the former 
Myrtle Rhea, was roared In Mun­
day and will be rememtiered by 
many local people.

Mr. McFarlln was one of the 
founders of Gore»' and was man­
ager of the West Texas Supply 

| Company there for many years.
I He has plon»*ere»l In oil produc- 
| tlon.

KENNETH OWENS ARE 
PARENTS OF DAUGHTER

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Owens 
are announcing the arrival of a 
daughter who made her appear­
ance at the Knox County Hos­
pital Monday, April 19th. She 
tipped the scales at 7 pounds and 
7 ounces, and has been named 
Carla Ann. Mrs. Owens Is the 
former Joan Bryan.

Maternal grandmother Is Mrs. 
Ida Hollowey of Haskell and 
paternal grandparents ar»* Mr. 
and Mrs. E. M. Owens of Knox 
City.

Mr. nnd Mrs. Clifford Moore 
of El Centro, Calif., are here this 
week renewing old acquaintan­
ces. The Moores are former resi­
dents of Munday and are en- 
route from Michigan to their 
home In El Centro. Mrs. Moore 
will be remembered ns the form 
er Martha Smith.

Miss Joan Duke of Wichita 
Falls visited here with relatives 
from Thursday until Monday 
Mrs. A. B. Warren, Mrs. Ben 
Yarbrough a n d  Miss Donna 
Phillips took her home on Mon­
day and visited with her parents. 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Duke.

Haskell Sinking 
Convention To lie 
Sunday, April 25

The 30th annual Haskell Coun­
ty Singing Convention will he 
held In the American Legion 
Hall on Sunday, April 25th. ac­
cording to Information released 
by Halite E. Chapman, president 
of the county-wide association.

Several outstanding quartettes 
have notified officials that they 
will be present for the annual 
event which will begin at ten a. 
m. and will continue to well into 
t h e afternoon. Mr. Chapman 
states!. The Ozark Quartette of 
Wichita Falls will be h»*re again 
and also the Junior and Senior 
Tankersley Quartettes of Knox 
City.

F»*atured In a Saturday night 
concert will be the famous Ran 
ger Quartette of Dallas who will 
also remain over for the annual 
»convention on Sunday.

Other outstanding quartettes 
if this area are expected to be 

j here and a full day's program of 
, good music Is promlswl to all 
guests making It a point to nt- 
ten this 30th annual convention.

Sound **qiupment will h«> furn­
ished through the courtesy of 
the Gulf Oil Corporation of 
Houston and perllmlnary plans 
for the program to be broadcast 
through Radio Station KDWT 
are under way.

The annual singing convention 
is cosponsored by the Haskell 
Chamber of Commerce.

Mr. and Mrs. E. M. Jackson 
ond Judy and Mrs. A. A. Clark 
of Dallas visited Mr. and Mrs 1.
L. West and Lennle over the 
week end attended the wedding 
of Joyce West and W. H. King 
In Red Springs Friday evening

RELEASE OF I ’M  SED 
COTTON ALLOTMENT

Anyone that has a cotton al­
lotment for 1954 in excess of 
what they Intend to plant, may 
release it to the County Commit­
tee. The committee will then re­
apportion it to other farms in 
the county.

May 4. 1954 is the final date 
for releasing unusted acreage 

It will be an ;>dv antnge to the 
! county If you will release the 
1 acreage you do not intend to 
plant as It will help hold up th.? 

[County History for the County.

Knox County 
Hospital Notes

Patients in the Knox County 
Hospital April 19th:

Roy Phillips. Munday: Mrs. 
Oscar Hudspeth, Guthrie: Mrs. 
Allie Ware, Munday; Miss Jo 
Denton. Knox City; Mrs. Minnie 
Olson, Gilliland; I. F. Spikes, 
Knox City; Mrs. W. R. Whitten. 
Clyde; Mrs. Joe Watkins, Knox 
City; Mrs. G. B. Busby, Knox 

jClty; Mrs. Louise Merchant, 
Weinert; Mrs. Kenneth Owens, 
and baby daughter, Munday; 
Mrs. M. Monteyo, Munday; Mrs. 
R. W. Gr»*enwoo,d Rochester; 
Mrs. J. W. Hayes, Knox City; 
Sylvia Cantano. Knox City; Jes 
ale Dixon. Monday; Mrs. Victor­
ia Ramos, and baby son, Roches­
ter; Mrs. Felicia Zamora and 
baby. Knox City; Mallard Baby 

¡Girl, Knox City; Bacela Paz, O’- 
i Brien; Mrs. Jimmy Green and 
baby, Benjamin.

Patients dismissed since Mon­
day, April 12th:

Arthur Monteyo. M u n d a y ;  
John Monteyo, Munday; Mrs. M. 
G. Nix, Munday; Mrs. W. S. Me- 
Nltt, Sweetwater; Baby McNitt. 
Sweetwater; Mrs. Sam E. Clonts, 
Knox City; Stella Mac Jones, 
Munday; F. G Offutt, Munday; 
Miss Georgia Montandon, Knox 
City; Perry Wheeler. Amarillo; 
Mrs. John Hansen, Knox City; 
Mrs. Jack Davis, Alpine; Mrs. 
Frank Salman. Rochester; Mrs 
Wesley Tralnham, Vera; E. E. 
Teaff. Knox City; Mrs Emogene 
Mallard and baby girl, Knox 
City; C. O. Scott, Munday; Mrs. 
W T. Brlnegar Knox City; Mrs.
M. L. Lewis, Knox City; Mrs 
David Slaughter. Knox City; j 
Mrs. J. L. Galloway, Benjamin. 

Births:
Mr. and Mrs f. Mallard. Knox 

City, a »laughter.
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Given, 

Benjamin, a son.
Mr. and Mrs V. Ramos. Roch­

ester. a son
Mr. anr Mrs F. Zamora. Knox 

City, a daughter
Mr. and Mrs Kenneth Owen«. 

Munday, a daughter.

F. F. A. Chapter 
Qualifies For 
State Contest

E. R. Ponder, advisor, carried 
three teams to the Area IV F. F. 
A. judging contest at Stephen 
vilk* on April 12.

Th»* poultry team was compos­
ts! of Noble Flennikcn, Pete 
Kister. and Collis Michels, and 
ihe following scores we»*r made* 
Noble, 309 Si; Pete. 267'n; and 
Collis. 281. Total score. 858.

The dairy cattle team a'id 
th»*ir scores are: Johnny rtrsak 
350; Claud»* Hill. 292; and Jimmy 
Morgan. 232. This team ranked 
fifth in the area and qualif'ed 
to »’nter the state judging contest 
at A. & M. College on May 1. 
Orsak was first in the area and 
won a scholarship as an award.

The livestock judging team 
and their scores are: Robert 
Hertel. 364; Byron Gass, 40J, 
and Howard Smith, 198; total 
1,064.

The m»*at and judging team 
was compoMil of Jerry Bob 
Goodwin. Ia*on Johnson and 
Charles Yost. The milk team has 
not h»»en chosen for elimination, 
as yet. and will enter the area 
contest at Fort Worth on Satur­
day. April 24. while the dairy 
team will enter the judging con­
test at Texas T«*ch.

Herbert W . Ford 
In Anti-aircraft 
( ’enter. Ft. liliss

FORT BLISS Pvt Herbert 
W Ford, son of Mr. and Mrs. L. 
H Ford, Box 445, Munday. was 
recently assigned to the Anti­
aircraft Artillery Replacement 
Training Center at Ft Bliss Tex­
as, for his second eight week cy­
cle of basic training.

During this s«*cond phase of 
basic training he will be expert­
ly schooled In the firing of light 
and medium antiaircraft artil­
lery weapons at low-flying and 
high altitude aerial targets on 
the one and one half million acre 
Fort Bliss ranges. He will also 
be familiarizi'd with the various 
electronic »»qulpmrnt used by 
the AAARTC

Upon completion of this cycle 
he will graduate at a formal pa­
rade and retreat ceremony, and 
then he eligible for assignment 
In a permanent anti-aircraft ar­
tillery unit.

TO ENGINEER SOCIETY
John Pur wood Scott has been

vertently overlooked in the mail-1 
ing of our letters, the fireboys 
ire sorry, and they will send a 
man to sw  you If you will call."

A display of sample exting- 
[ u ishers has been set up In the 
show window at the Firestone 

1 store, and anyone desiring one 
or more may order there.

Chief Johnson says: "It is to I 
the interest of everyone to have j 

I one or more extinguishers in the ! 
i horn»- because they might save 
a home from destruction, and 
might save a life."

RRAZOK VALUCY POSTAL 
EMPLOYEES IN MEET AT 
BENJAMIN ON APRIL 1»

Employeees of the Brazos Val- 
l»*y Postal Association met In the 
home of Postmaster Tom W»*st, 
Monday, April 19th. Miss Merle 
Dingus of Munday led in the 
business discussion. Postmaster 
Jeff Graham of Knox City gave 
an interesting report of the post­
masters convention in San An­
tonio. He was installed, at the 
convention, as State President 
of the Texas Chapter of the Na 
tional Association of Postmast­
ers.

Cake and colter were serv«Hi 
to employees from Vera. Rule, 
Munday, Knox City, Goree. 
Wrtnert and the host and host­
ess. Mr. and Mrs. West, of Ben­
jamin.

The next meeting will be held 
in Vera May 17th.

Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Ballard and 
children were visitors in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Don Jac­
obs in Truscott during the East­
er holidays. Other visitors in the 
Jacob home were Mr. and Mrs. 
G. C. Cole of Vera, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Flanery of Haskell. Mr. 
and Mrs. Archie Struck and 
children o f Gore»- and Mr. and 
Mrs. Pete Moinzer and children 
of Benjamin.

Officers participating In the 
raids were: Sheriff H. T. Melton.
and Deputy H. C. Stone. Knox 
Count> Attorney T. W. Bulling- 
ton; Jim Martin and Jack Smith 
of the license and w’elghta divis­
ion; J. W. Massey, local chief of 
police, and undercover men with 
the State Liquor Control Board.

Last Man’s Club 
Organized Here; 
Officers Named

The Last Man's Club, compos­
ed of World War I veterans of
Knox County was formed at a 
meeting here last Friday night. 
A fried chicken supper was serv­
ed prior to the business session.

Officers for the club w’ere 
elected as follows: Kirby Fitzger­
ald. president; Ozie Turner of 
Truscott, vice president; R. M. 
Almanrode, secretary, and Ar- 
delle Spelce, treasurer. Twenty- 
five veterans were present, and 
all but one sigm^d for member­
ship in the club. It is estimated 
that about 100 veterans of World 
War I reside in the county.

The club voted to meet twice 
a year on Memorial Day and 
Armistcie Day. The next meeting 
will be at Benjamin on May 30.

Memorial Orbali 
Presented To Goree 
.Methodist Church

Mr. and Mrs. Purvey Scott of 
Los Angcics, Calif., came in last 
Thursday for a visit here with 
his mother, Mrs. Ida Scott, and 
sisters, Mrs. Dee Allred and Mrs. 
Herman Floyd, and their famil­
ies.

Drive carefully. The life you 
save may be your own.

Jim Killian of Mt View, Ark., 
Mrs L. S. Sweatt and George 
Killian visited Mr Hayes Sweatt 
and other relative in Lubbock 
last Tuesday and Wednesday. 
Jim Killian has been visiting 
here the past two weeks.

Weather Report
For seven days ending 7 P. M. 

April 21, 1954. as compiled by H. 
P. Hill, U. S. Weather Observer.

Special services Easter Sunday 
were held at the Goree Metho­
dist Church when an ei«,ctric or­
gan was presented as a memor­
ial to th»* late Mr. and Mrs. W. 
W. Coffman. Rev. J. W. Baugh­
man made the presentation at 
the begining of the morning wor­
ship service on behalT of the 
children of the couple; Floyd 
Coffman, W. F. Coffman. Lois 
Coffman Moore, Neva Coffman 
Krnn«*dy, Jo Coffman McWhort­
er, and Walter W Coffman.

Special readings were led by 
the pastor, Walter Hadley, In 
dedicating the Instrument to the 
worship of God. Carol Coffman 
was organist for the regular 
services.

During the afternoon. Mrs. 
Pearl Stalcup Falls, of Throck­
morton, former Goree resident 
and church pianist, gave an in­
formal nn-ital of organ music.*A 
number of relatives and friends 
were present for these service*.

elected a member of the Ameri­
can Society of Civil Engineers, 
oldest national organization of April 15 .

LOW 
1954 1953 

.  62 50

HIGH
1954-1953
76 75

engineers In the country. He is Aprii 16 .  45 38 70 76
the son of Mr. and Mrs. J. B. April 17 .. 49 57 86 94
Scott o f Munday. April 18 55 37 89 80

.............. — -  ■ April 19.. .. 61 32 90 65
Mr. and Mrs. Percy Eason, April 20._ .  64 35 88 78

Marc and Melissa, of Ralls and April 21... 66 46 84 89
Mrs. W. A. Eason of Lorenzo 
were guests In the home of Mr.

Precipitation to date, 
1954 _____________ __ 3.39 in.

and Mrs. E. R. Ponder for the 
Easter holidays.

Precipitation to 
1953 ...............

this date,
__ 4.45 In.

LEGION'S BASEBALL 
TEAM OPENS TRAINING

The American Legion baesball 
team will hold their first work­
out next Friday after five o’­
clock. it was announced Wednes­
day.

There is no age limit this year. 
Anyone from 16 to 60 who 1« 
able to play is lnvltf*d to meet 
for workout Friday.

Visiting In the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Melvin Gray *nd Leroy 

' for the Easter holidays were 
their daughter and son-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Thomson, 
and little »on, David, of Pecos.
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TME W OKUfS BEST INVESTMENT
We In Texas have always had sincere sym­

pathy for our fellow1 men in the other 47 states. 
Over the past 100 years or so, we've tried to 
Boost the morale of these unfortunates by telling 
and showing them that Texas is truly God's spot 
an earth.

Apparently, we've dune a good job. Two and 
a half million “outsiders" in the past few years 
•awe been welcomed within our boundaries «is 
settlers on Texas soil. But this creates a problem. 
For if this rate of immigration continues we will 

rt running out of the wule open spates so 
»r to a native Texan's heart Now we hear 

thing that sounds like a solution to the 
problem

Some folks in Fort Bend County, near Hous­
ton. are oflering out-of-staters the opportunity to 
share in the privileges and pleasures of Texas 
land ownership and still go on living in one of 
the other 48. Headed by Captain M T. 'Lone 
Waif i Gonzaulias of Texas Ranger fame, the 
L a y  C Ranch, lncroporated. t*f Sugarland Is 
si taring Its property w-ith anyone interested 
« tough In Texas to put up 175. We figure that's 
quite a lot of people.

For six bits, you get ownership of a two-square 
itch  tract of good, rich Texas land. A bona fide 
deed states which two-inch square on the Lazy 
C  is yours.

While this is too small a tract to pitch a tent 
an. U is enough to brag about and we think in- 
•estzrent in any Texas land is so good people 
• ill want to come down just to see their proper 
fy. We know all Texans will welcome their fel­
low land owners when they come south And mo- 
h-l and hotel owners in Houston and elsewhere 
hi the state will make every effort to make the 
visiting landowners comfortable while they are

C l B s co t 'T S  LEARN ABOUT OH.
This April, tens of thousands of Cub Scouts 

are learning about the oil industry. With parental 
aid. they will spend considerable time preparing 
exhibits, displays and projects revolving around 
this great enterprise. An oil industry organiza­
tion has made 100.000 informative kits a\ailable 
to help in the work, and these have been dis 
tributed by the National Cub Scout organization.

It is certainly desirable that our very young 
citizens should be given an insight into Ameri 
can industry, and oil is a good example It is an 
absolutely essential enterprise in either peace or 
war All through its centuryold history, the oil 
industry and the people Involved in it have dem­
onstrated those characteristics and habits of 
mind that we think of as typically American. 
These include hard work, the willingness to take 
long risks in the hope of reward, the urge to do 
a better job than the other fellow, the unremit­
ting search for improved products, the determina­
tion to grow and to progress and give good ser­
vice and good value to the customer. An. in the 
American tradition, it is intensely competitive 
through and through.

Youngsters are often exposed to sweeping de­
nunciations of American enterprise and the 
American way of doing things. They should be 
shown the falsity of such charges

(TKUUMSTANUfe. JUSTIFY 
EMI

Rom. 12:17, Recompense to 
no man evil for evil." This 
verse teaches that no circum­
stances or situation justifies a 
man In wrong doing. No injury, 
or Insult, or slight is sufficient 
cause to excuse the one who 
does evil. A man deceived him­
self. when he reasons that the 
hurt he has suffered is ground 
for taking vengeance in his 
own hands and retaliating with 
evil against his adversary. A 
man deceives himself when he 
thinks, because his adversary 
tries to cheat him. he is at lib 
erty to take advantage and 
swindle. A man is deceived 
when he suffers real or lmag 
Inary offense from a member 
of the church and thinks 
therefore he is vindicated if he 
wants to quit and forsake the 

I church Be not deceived. No rir 
1 cumstance is sufficient warrant

for a man to do evil.
Balance the Good and

Evil
James 2:10. “ For whosoever 

shall keep the whole law. and 
yet offend In one point, he is 
guilty of all.” This teaches, 
when we offend In one item, 
we disregard the authority of 
the lawgiver and are in rebel­
lion and guilty of all. Obedi- 
ence to part of the will of God 
will not offset disobedience to 
another command. There is a 
popular deception that the 
good and evil that a man has 
done will be halanred In the 
judgment; if the good out­
weighs the evil he will in* ush I 
ered into heaven. Then the de 
ceptive idea, that a man who j 
has two good habits can prac 
lice vice. Be not deceived, with 
part obedience and part dis 
obedience, such a mixture of 
good and evil will not please 
Jehovah

Ml NUAY t III Ki ll O F (H H IS T  
BOX 211 — I’ lione 6151 

(L IF F O R D  W ILBON. Evangelist

O K A »  KOOT> OPINION
HARDIN MONT ANT. TRIBINE HERALD:

“ We're not trying to p r o v e  there isn't unem 
ploy merit at the present time, or that It is not a 
serious problem, but it does seem that some 
groups, for obvious reasons are overemphasiz 
tmr die situation These same groups often are 
Ibe first to advocate more government spending 
as a means of curbing unemployment and a --ur 
mg prosperity. The federal government cannot 
farever operate with a ileficit. Increase spending 
and then cut taxes It isn't in the cards

GUARANTEE OF VALUE
All of us naturally like to find bargains. All 

oí us. when shopping, try to get top return lor 
each dollar spent. And In the long run. the surest 
way to achieve that is to patronize established 
merchants who are concerned with the future - 
not just today's sales.

That was the theme of an editorial In the Gar­
ner. Iowa. Leader. The paper advised its readers: 
"In any home town, the reputable merrhants and 
dealers will be the kind of people that you like 
and trust. This editor does not think you w ill lose 
any peace of mind or money if you rely on them 
for good values at a fair price. I am sure you 
will find this procedure Is much safer and simp­
ler than searching for bargains In strange plac 
es."

Many a "bargain" bought at an alleged big dis­
count from some fly-by night operator, has prov­
en worthless. The establishod local merchants, 
chain and independent, have to protect their repu­
tations and that's your best guarantee of value.

"The public business of the nation Is the pri- 
ite business of every citizen." War Cry.

D. C  Eiland 
M. D.

PHYSICIAN A SURGEON

MUNDAY. TEXAS

Mahan-Mc( au ley 
F uneral Home

OXYGEN EQUIPPED
a m b u l a n c e  s e r v ic e

la v  Phone Ntt# Phone
3451 3451

MUNDAY. TEXAS

Dr. Frank ('. Scott
Specialist an tnaea iee 

•no -»urgerv j|

EYE. EAR. N ust. THROAI 
AND FITTtNC. OF GLASSES

HASKELL TEXAS 
Office in Clinic Bldg , 1 bloat 
North and S  Block West of 

Haskell Nat’l Bank

ELECTRIC
Service

— MtrrOK WINDING

— RADIO REPAIRS

Cliff Moorman
I «oree, Texas — Phone II

R. 1«. Newsom 
M. D.

PHYSICIAN A SURGEON

Office Phone 2341 
Rea Phone 4.11

MUNDAY. TEXAS

KM HIM STCD10
Haskell. Texas

• PORTE AITS
•  COMMERCIAL/!

• KODAK.!
• WEDDINGS

-P h o n e  4.WW —

The story of the Adobe Walls 
goes back to famous Kit Carson 
for he helped to found the little 
settlement more than a century 
a g o - the first buildings erected 
by white men In the Panhandle 
of Texas. It was more than a 
trading post to which Indians 
came but. after several seasons. 
Apaches attacked took the hors 
es and that let! to abandonment 
of the post. Many years went by 
and then in 1K7I the buffalo 
hunters came and in sight of 
the crumbling, old abode walls, 
a new settlement sprang u p -  
two stores, a blacksmith shop 
and a saloon.

The killing of buffalo was 
proceeding a pare when Indians 
began to ambush the scattered 
hunters, so they gathered in the 
little settlement. After a lew- 
days. however, (he apprehension 
of further attarlcs dial down and 
wagons wen- loaded and the 
men were in readines to set out 
again the next morning to re­
sume the hunt. The talk that 
night was about the prospects of 
big money-making; and at Han- 
rahan's saloon, with Its unpalnted 
pine har, jc-ts were bandied bark 
and forth and practical Jokes 
brought roors of laughter

It was midnight when the last 
men lay down to sleep. Silence 
reigned. Two o'clock in the morn­
ing. Suddenly a shot rang out 
like the crack of a rifle. It was 
the crackling of the ridge-pole in 
the saloon. The men slreping 
there were awakened and. fear­
ing that the roof (which was 
covered with dirt > might cave in. 
they called for aid. A prop was 
put up and the ridge-pole was ex­
amined and a most amazing 
thing was found: there was an- 
solutely no sign of a break in 
the ridgepole The men talked 
about the occurrence until the 
first streaks of dawn.

Billy Dixon, famous scout, 
whose wife later wrote "The

Life of Billy Dixon”  tP. L. Tur 
ner Co., Dallas» was busy about 
Ills wagon when he heard a 
noise like thunder and he saw- 
one of the men running toward 
him and. half a mile or so be 
hind, came the Indians.

Qunnah Parker, the Comanche 
chief, had stirred his nation as 
well as the Kiowas and Cheyen­
nes to go on the war-path to 
w i|H- out the hide-hunters who 
were exterminating ihe buffalo 
in this red man's hunting ground. 
Had not that ridge pole cracked 
mysteriously, the entire group 
of 28 men and one woman would 
still have boon a sloop when the 
attack came!

Dixon fired a rifle in w arning 
and the hunters took refuge in 
the buildings all except two 
men who were killed In-fore they 
could spring from their blankets 
and seize guns. Desperately the 
26 men and the wife of one of 
them barricaded doors and win­
dows with sacks of grain and 
flour. The mass of redskins 
surged against the walls, some 
whirling their horses and back­
ing them against the doors in an 
effort to forre them open. Some 
of the attackers thrust pistols 
and rifles through the windows 
and fired.

The warw hoops were almost 
deafening But the hunters went 
into action with their booming 
buffalo guns, making every bul­
let count, and soon the rooms 
were thick with gun smoke and 
the ground was strewn with the 
bodies of Indians.

The attackers drew back be­
fore the deadly defense and sjmhI 
away; hut it was only to return 
and this time they raced around 
the buildings and fired into the 
windows as they dashed by. 
They were driven back again 
because they were op|Kised by as 
fine a set of marksmen as could 
be found in all the West Again 
and again the Indians attacked; so 
many times that the white men 
lost count. At the end of the day- 
only one of the buffalo-hunters 
had lost his life in addition to

SUN. SET
DRIVE-IN

Iasi Time*- Fri. Aurll 23

- 6 0 C P  / /

« s a f r a
«■b  t s> s «»• he

Sal Only. April 24

DROOPY CARTOON

Sun.Mon..April 25-26 
STEVE CO< HK.AN

—in—
‘Shark River”

TOM dt JERKY CARTOON

Tues. Wed., April 27 28
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ANNI
BANCROFT

Tut cm awn «. «w va  J  ■

DISNEY CARTOON

Tliurv FrL. April 29 30 
ROD CAMERON

- -in—
“The Steel Lady”

CASPER CRTOON

the two who were slain at the 
outset. And the close of the day 1
saw the close of the Battle of 
Adobe Walls though for a week, 
from time to time, bands of In­
dians could be seen surveying 
the situation from a distant { 
bluff and one of these occasions, I 
Billy Dixon achieved immortality 1 
by killing an Indian chief w-ith 
a rifle at a distance of almost ; 
seven-eighU of a mile.

Years afterward when Quanah 1 
Parker was told Billy Dixon was , 
one of the men who fought ! 
against him at Adobe Walls, he 
leaned from his horse and shook 
hands with his former foe.

ROXY
Fri. Night Sat. Matinee, 

April 23-24 
HEX ALLEN 

SUM PICKENS
—in—

“Phantom
Stallion”
Chapter One 

"GUNFIGHTER8 o f  
THE NORTHWEST**

Sal. Night Only. April 24
f DOUBLE 
I FEATURE!

in u h u a B M ftM

- and -
STERLING h a v o e n

—In —
‘Crime Wave”
Sun.-Mon., April 23-26

CARTOON —NOV’ FXY— 
NEWS

Tues. Wed. Thursday. 
April 27 28 29

COMEDY NEWS

CHAS. M00RH0USE
Cattle • Land - Insurance

MUNDAY PHONE 6811 BENJAMIN PHONB 2181

Day—WRECKER SERVICE—Night
Phone: D A Y  3291' NIGHT 393«

AUTO GLASS INSTALLED—-Glass rat f  o r anything, 
•eat wfndbliields installed.

New Seat Cover Materials
Thin new material la guaranteed not to SHOCK. BURN or 

STAIN.

Munday Taint and Body Shop
+  W e Specialize in Rebuilding W recki

FARM
EQUIPMENT

H Farmall tractor, recondi­
tioned and guaranteed

1948 F o r d  tractor with 
planter and cultivator.

M Farmall tractor, recou­
nt loned and guaranteed.

Rogers & Mann,
Inc.

FARMALL Hoaae"

W. M. Taylor, M. I).

Physician and Surgeon 
Office In Rogers Drug Store

GOREK, TEXAS
Phones:

Office 47 Rea 38

fought. It is one of the mile­
stones In the story of the South- 

Today. great ranches, produc- j west, 
live farms, colleges, churches ■ — ■..
and cities mark the empire David Elland, who is attending 
where unit* the bufflao roamed Texas University in Austin, spent 
and the red man rode and the j the holidays here with his par- 
Battle of Adobe Walls w a s  ents. Dr. and Mrs. D. C. Eiland.

Arthritis?
I have been wonderfully bless- '■ 

ed in being restored to active | 
life after being crippled in nearly 
every Joint In my body and with 
muscular soreness from head to 
foot. I had Rheumatoid Arthritis 
and other forms of Rheumatism, 
hands deformed and my ankles 
were set.

IJmited space prohibits telling 
you more here but If you will 
write me I will reply at once and 
tell you how I received this won­
derful relief.

Mrs. Lela S. Wier
2803 Arbor Hills Drive 

P. O. Box 2695 
Jackson 7, Mississippi

Dr. E. 0 . McClellan
OPTOMETRIST 
Haskell, Texas

At KNOX ( ITY
Every Wednesday and 

Friday
Hours 1 to 3 P. M. 

Phone 3132 Knox City

UtOce Hours: 
»12 2-6

Jtrtce Li' 
on Thursdays

Dr. Fidelia Moylette
CHIROPRACTOR

Phone 4351 Munday. Texas
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HAMLIN SAND & GRAVEL CO., Inc. 
Route 4, Hamlin, Texas

Call on us for your building material needs, quality ma­
terials. passing Architect and State Highway Specification«. 
Washed and graded concrete sand, concrete gravel, roofing
gravel, filter rock, shooting gravel. All materials careful!» 
washed, screened and graded to specifications. Rail dellv 
ery or by 12 yard trucks- Prompt and courteous attention 
will be given to ali Inquiries.

PHONEHt 1M4 M Stamford 
MM FI Hamlin 
216M Abilene

EVERY TYPE of

Banking Service
\\ hatever your banking1 requirements, 

you will find that we offer a most com­
plete sendee in all departments, giving 

I you every .service consistent with good 
. banking.

C ome in, discuss y o u r  requirements 
with us.

T h e  F ir s t  N a t i o n a l  B a n k
IN MUNDAY

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
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News From The 
U. S. Congress

Congreeanian Frank I karri

During the past lew weeks, 
we have all been reading and 
seeing a lot about the most re­
sent hydrogen bomb explosion in 
the Pacific. The awfulness of 
this new weapon was impressed 
on me when I saw the pictures 
of this explosion a month or six 
weeks ago. These pictres have 
been released to the public, and 
possibly many of you have seen 
them. After seeing the motion 
pictures of this terrible weapon 
and reading of its devastating 
effect, 1 am sure we have been 
startled to learn that one bomb 
can destroy large cities and that 
it ripped a hole in the earth 
where it exploded large enough 
to hold fifteen buildings the sire 
of our national capital. In reflec­
ting on the effect that this new 
development will have upon all 
of us. I have thought many 
times that that momentous little 
word. " I f ,  will be so important 
to all of us in the coming months 
and years. "If" is one of the 
shortest and most meaningful 
words in our language. It is writ­
ten across every promise of spir­
itual guidance and enrichment.
From (ienesls to Revelation we 
are constanly assured that cer- j 
tain things will happen sure as j 
the rising sun if if the condi­
tions are fufilled. If this new 
source of energy that man has 
stumbled upon is dedicated to the 
benefits of mankind, it will rev­
olutionize our future and bring 
to us many advantages and bene­
fits we have never before dream­
ed of. If it is dedicated to war. 
the advancement of our civiliza­
tion is at an end. and everything 
that we know. love, and cherish 
is finished. The great hope of our 
time is that the “ ifs" may be re- j 
solved for peace and humanity 
and that we as a nation of peo- j 
pie and that peoples everywhere 
may continue to make a rational ' 
choice among the “ ifs".

This week the House passed 
the Agriculture Appropriation 
Bill for the fiscal year beginning 
July 1st. This bill furnishes the 
funds that arp necessary to carry 
on the agricultural program.
Among other things, it made 
appropriations for agricultural . . . »
research, the Agricultural Ex- I ^he Public Speaking pro­
tension Service, forest develop- Kram- ,r\ which thousands of 
ment. soil conservation, agricul-1 an<* K*rls throughout the
tural marketing services. Na- na,ion hav‘‘ learned how to 
tional school lunch fund, plant sP<*ak convincingly, has been re- 
and animal diseases and pest I noweti by the State Extension 
control, upstream flood preven­
tion. and other programs and

REAL, genuine elephant feet shown be­
ing manicured, then upholstered with 
leopard skin in Seattle .shop, for use as

GRIM face of French Legion- 
naue reflects luggedness of 
fighting that may have seen up 
to 30.000 Red attackers killed 
in Indo-China warfare

STANKV St S<>n (Eddie and 
Mike. 2 1 do a little joint mas­
terminding on St Louis Card­
inals’ bench

I

Political
Announcements

The Munday Times la author­
ized to announce the candidacy 
of the following, aubject to the 
action of the voters in the 1053 
Democratic Primaries-

For County Superintendent: 
MRS. iJiE HAVMRS 
MKKIFK McGACGIIKV

i Re-election)

For Tax Assessor-Collector:
Kl) THOMPSON
M. A. (Ruddy) HI MPAS, Jr. 

(Re-c lection)
For County Treasurer:

C. It i Clyde) HENDRIX 
MRS. FRANK Hil.L 
W. F. SNODV

(Re-election)
For District Attorney, 

oOlli Judicial District:
ROY A. JONES 

< Re-election)
TilOS. F. GLOVER 
A. W. DAVIS

For County Clerk:

MRS. ZEN A WALDRON
(First elective term)

For County Judge:
L. A. (Louis) PARKER

(First elective term)
For Sheriff, Knox County:
HOMER T. MELTON

(Re-election)
T. O. McMINN 
GROVER COFFMAN

For Commissioner of Precinct 
One:
T. C. CARTER 
Kl> SHAVER 
LIAIYII WAIJIKIF

For ( (Hnniissioner of Precinct 
Four:
GEORGE M X  

(Re-election)
HICK TIDWELL 
TERRY HARRISON

For Justice of 1‘esce,
Precinct •:
JOHN C. RICE

(Re-election)
For State Representative,

H3rd District:
E. J .(Ed) CLOUD

For Commissioner of Precinct 
Three:
J. B. EUBANK. JR.

C. A. BULLION
(Reflection)

For District Clerk:
E. A. (Buck) PROPPS

For County Attorney:

T. W. BULUNGTON
(Re-election)

Mrs. Bessie McKee of 
visited her sister. Mrs. Elite
Ups. last week.

BACKYARD BEACH trend is expected to result thi-, yeat in 
sales of $150,000,000 worth of inflatable pinducts like B F- 
Goodrich's popular Koroseal play pond and new companion 
piece, air mat of ¡»ante material Demand is double that of 
record 1953

RENEW 4-11 PI BMC 
SPEAKING PROGRAM 
FOR FIFTH YEAR

services connected with agricul­
ture. This bill placed consider­
able emphasis on agricultural 
research.

Visitors from home this week 
were Mr. Bill Wright and R. H. 
Coffee of Vernon; Senator Wayne 
W. Wagonseiler of Bowie, Mr. 
Boyd Kelley. Mr. Rhea Howard, 
and Mr. Dwight M. Ross, Jr., of 
Wichita Falls.

IT  PAYS TO ADVERTISE

Service for 1954.
This is the fifth consecutive 

year that the Pure Oil Company 
has provided the awards in this 
program.

County and state awards are 
offered by the donor in 26 states.
County-wide public .speaking fin 
als will be arranged by Exten­
sion agents, and the outstanding 
boy and girl in each county will 
receive a gold filled medal of 
honor. The state awards are a 
19-Jewel watc hfor the high rank­
ing boy, and a set of silverware

for the top ranking girl.
In addition, two college schol­

arships of $30000 each and two 
all-expense trips to the 33rd Na- i 
tional 4-H Club Congress next 
November will he swarded to a [ 

14-H boy and girl selected from j 
the state winners All states are l 
eligible to submit candidates for 
these national awards.

The two national 4-H Public j 
Speaking achievement winners ' 

i last year were Rosemary Glad- 
, hart Highland. Kansas, and Hilly 
Sam Moore, of Petersburg. Ten 
m*ssee.

The program is directed b> the 
Cooperative Extension Service.

Nee You In Church Sunday

To Our Insureds
The '$10(1.00 Deductible Clause now at­

tached to all building and dwelling in­
surance policies located in town, can be 
eliminated by endorsement and the $50.- 
00 Deductible Clause attached with a 
small additional charge.

You must notify your agent if you de­
sire this change made in your policy.

J. C. BORDEN AGENCY
J. C. HARPHAM AGENCY
M00RH0USE INS. AGC’Y.

MUNDAY

CHAS. M00RH0USE 
INSURANCE AGCY.

BENJAMIN

W.W. COFFMAN INS. AGC’Y.
GOKEE

Vmi’ve had a ch tnoe to size up the 1954 automobiles. 
You’ve read al>out, heard about all the claims for economy,
jKTfomianee, acceleration, endurance, roominess and ride.
Now you’re set to compare the facts, weigh the record.

New’54 DODGE 
Clinches What it Claims!

Dodg« lo ya l V I  Fovr-Door Seda*

SNELL CHEMICAL CORPORATION
l*OI MflUOM auUMMO, HOUSTON |, TIMS

MUNDAY COTTONOIL MILL
Munday, Texas

Here's the Record No Other Car Can Match

PR O V ED  A mart c o *  Oroot 
Econom y lig ht Dodga »« 
tha Ant car to combine 
ftothing porformanco with 
top economy Dodga prov­
ed it« oRceilont o ilo ag a  in 
tha MobilQa» Economy Ron

PRO VED  Am  orica'« Ovh  
• hindi n 9 Perforator On 
the bonne villa Soft Flati 
Dodge «honored every roc
o rd  in if« c lo tt  for per 
formane# to demonstrate 
re«erve power for %a fety

PR O V ED  A m o fira t  Top PRO VED  Americo'« Oreet
Endwrafua Cor In official M l t o o .  C m  At •  Anal
AAA te»tt tha '54 Ckxlgo IO Al «M M K S .4
traveled farthor and fatter rood . n W m  A t  '34
than any othor A mem on D o d f .  t ta t  i t l . d t t  a t
cor Mere • clinching proof O lftao l fo c a  C ar far %»
et D o . . .  d .pandabikty fci4>ono paBi M O  Mila ta<a.

Dodge barfo up prnmi* with proof!
You get outstanding economy, proved 

in the Mobilga-« Economy Run.
You get ivorri breaking performance 

proved on the Bonneville Salt Flat«.
You get hi«tory-making endurance 

prove«) in the most grueling official AAA 
teeta

If you like proved value, come see how 
much more I lodge offer«.

DEPENDABLE 54

DODGE
Mtn • M M l  M b in •

REEVES MOTOR COMPANY
Dodge-Plymouth Cara Dodge “Job-Rated”  Trucks Munday, Texas

From where I sit... ¿y Joe Marth

So They Stopped 
Baiting Each Other

If you want to hear a real 
hankie, linten to Cob Jam«-» and 
Whiley Baker on Irout linhing 
aometimr. You'd think it war 
more important than anything.

Cob favor» dry flies. Whitey 
pooh-pooh» anything hut wet 
fliea. Cob »wear» by a Fan-Wing 
Royal Coachman; Whitey won't 
hear of anything hut Silver Doc­
tor. And no it goe» -they ran'l 
even get togethei on kt«-el rod» 
ver»us bamlaio rods

But on Saturday, each got ha«'k 
from Fox Creek with a catch that 
couldn’t have differed by more

than a couple of ounces! Than 
over a friendly gla»» of beer, they 
allowed asihow maybe they were 
hath right . . . which is how ae 
many arguments should end.

From »here I kit, life would hr 
s whole lot pleasanter if wr s i  
leaperted one another's opiniant- 
-whether alxiut trout lira. •  

having a glass of beer, or voting 
\fter all. a person has a right K  
lollow his own fine of thinking

OlLvuiJL
Lupyuyhl, L mini Slain Brrwtrt Fon

P A IN T

BRIGHTEN UP YOUR HOME AND  
ADD YEA RS TO ITS LIFE

Give your home now beauty and lotting protection with 
MINNESOTA quality house paint. See or phone mi far 
reliable painters.

N O T H IN G  D O W N
UP TO 3 YEARS TO PAY  

MAK E  E V E R Y  R OOM S P A R K L E
with

Ml N N FLO 112 COLORS
Easy-to-use, satin-lustre 
M INNFLO will odd distinc­
tive beauty to the rooms in 
y o u r  home. N o  odor .  

Apply Minnflo with handy 
roller and pan. Dries in less 
than on hour. You can't 
botch o job with Minnflo.

^ L M M o T ANO

I  T I N T S  I

N E W  W A L L P A P E R
In our collection of fine wallpaper there are hundreds of dis­
tinctive patterns and gorgeous colors in a price range to fit 
every budget Hove us repaper one room or your entire home. 

NOTHING DOWN — UP TO 3 YEARS TO FAY

■Q jrjT W
1 P O R C H  
^ a n d  

;J F L O O R  
E N A M E L

Choice of 10 colors. Ideal f o r  coment 
o i w a ll o* w o o d  flo o r*  M oda fo 
w ith sta n d  h a rd  w a a r  Dna» In a  
•hort firn#

F A R M E R S . . .
Visit our yard and tee the 

latest types of aluminum 

building products for tha 

farm Use aluminum far;

gutters, roof, siding, etc.

EASY PAYMENTS

★  Have Available F. H. A. and G. I. Fi­
nancing on Your lot and your plan or 
we will furnish (he lot Up to .‘10 year» 
to repay.

1 x 8 S 4 S FIR SH EATH ­
ING . . .  ____________________$7.75 pe TO#

RUBBER BASE EXTERIOR  
PAINT— for masonry— asbestos 
sid in g ....... .................................$5.50 per gai

COMPLETE STOCK of N EW  W ALL  
PAPER. Plenty of SPECIALS in dis­
count stock.

Wm. CameronT  Co.
B U IL D IN O  M A T E R IA LS  A N D  S I R V I C I I

/
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NEWS FROM VERA
(Mrs. Thelma Lee Coulston)

Holiday guests In the Fred 
Wiles home were Mrs. Wiles’ 
mother Mrs. Viva Gipson of Sil­
ver Valley, Audrta Gipson of Ca- 
nadiaa S/Sgt. and Mrs. Tommy 
Simonton of Amarillo, Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Tomlinson, Bill, Bob 
and Phil oi Miles, Derrel and Ar- 
vll Wiles oi the Navy, now stat | 
ioned at San Diego. Calif., and 
Walter Gipson and Tye Brown 
of Graham. Mr. and Mrs. H. F 
Norman and children o l Loren 
zo visited briefly in the Wiles 
home Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Spinks ol 
Goree visited Sunday in the Lee 
Feemster home.

Mr and Mrs. T. K. Holcomb 
and Bill of Elorado, Texas visited 
during the week end with Mrs. 
Holcomb's mother, Mrs. J. 1). 
Jefcoat.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Roberson 
of Truscott visited Sunday with 
Floyd's mother, Mrs. Jim Rober 
son.

The J. H. Adkisson family at­
tended the all-day P. C. A meet 
In, which was held in Stamford 
Friday

Miss Jessie Myers and her 
mother, Mrs. Minnie Myers, were 
in Dill City, Okla., for the week i 
end visiting with their sister and j 
daughter. Mrs. Roy Temeus.

Mr. and Mrs. Jewel Ridley and ! 
little daughter of Woodson visit­
ed Sunday with the Grady Har­
din family. The group spent Sun 
day at Lake Kemp

Bill and Elmer Rutledge visit­
ed recently with relatives in Ha* 
kelL

Sunday guests in the Hays 
and Laws homes were Billy 
Clyde of Fort Worth, Mary Fran 
ces of Denton. Bobby Paul and 
Mr. and Mrs. Ray Godfrey and 
Judy of Midland.

Visiting with their Nichols rel 
atives during the holiday were 
Mr. and Mrs. A, C. Nichols and 
family of Hobbs. N. M and Mr 
¿mil Mr* 1 Ml«* Nichols 'if \hrii 
hans.

Billy Parham spent Wednes­
day through Sunday of last week 
visiting with his sister. Mr and |

I Mre. Albert Patterson of Sey- 
| niour.

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Sess^m and 
i family of Lubbock were recent 
guests in the Norman Clark 

j home.
Mary Alice McGaughey of 

Denton spent the week end holi­
days with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. James McGaughey.

Mr. and Mrs. W 11. Peddy, 
Patsy, Nell and Jack visited with 
the Buster Peddy and J. C Ship- ! 
man families in Lubbock over I 
the week end.

Holiday visitors in the Lee 
Richards home were Mr. and 
Mrs. Chester Bohannan and chil- ! 
dren of Midland, Mr. and Mrs. 
Newton Richards and family of 
Comanche and Mrs. Junior Ped­
dy and children of Midland.

The Ferman Dowd family vis- 1 
ited with Mrs. Dowd’s parents, 
Mr and Mrs. A Caldwell of liol 
liday Friday and Saturday of 
last week.

MrS. Wesley Trainham was a 
patient in the Knox County Ho* 
pital Wednesday through Friday 
of last week.

Mr and Mrs. Maurice Hughe* 
and children spent the holiday j 
with Maurice's parents, Mr and 
Mrs Byron Hughes of Eunice
N. M, Mrs. Mattie Russell accom 
panted the couple home.

M iry Beth Ray of Abilene vis­
ited with her parents, Mr. and 
Pete Ray, over the week end.

Mrs. C. H. Cole and two 
daughters of Levelland visited in j 
the Sutton Beasley home during 
the week end. Mrs Beasley and j 
Mrs. Cole are sisters.

Paul Weiss, Edd Trainham and j 
Calvin Christian did some fish 
ing at Possum Kingdom Lake j 
Frday through SurnJay

The Jake Feemsters visit'si 
with Mrs. Feemster's mother 
Mrs. D. M. Groves of Mutf'ay 
Sunday

Holiday guests in the Bill Doss 
home were Mrs Doss's mother. 1 
Mrs. J. E  Miller Don Sue and 
Elizabeth of Odessa. Another 
sister Mrs. Roy Miller and chil 
dren have been visiting in the 
Doss home the past few weeks, j

Mr and Mrs Bill Randles of 
Brownfield visited in the Tom 
Russell home during the holl- |

days.
Mrs. John Barker and children 

of Jacksboro have been visiting 
in the home of Mrs. Barker's 
mother. Mrs. I n a Murphree. 
Wanda Lee accompanied Mrs. 
Barker home Sunday night.

lmogene Park and Dick John 
son of Wichita Falls visited in 
the Claud Park home Sunday.

Visiting in the A. M. Bradford 
home during the holidays were 
Mr. and Mrs. Calvin Campbell 
and children of Wichita Falls. 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Bradford 
and children of Nacoua and Mr. 
and Mrs. Garvin King and chil­
dren of Seymour.

Mrs. Roxy Morris of Goree has 
been visiting in the home of her 
daughter, Mrs. Bill Townsen and 
family.

Week end guests in the L. A. 
Christian home were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Bentley of Dalhart, 
Mr. and Mrs. David Patterson of 
Dumas. Mr. and Mrs. Joe Smith 
of Fort Worth. Mr. and Mr*. 
Morris Christian of Wichita Falls 
and Mrs Martin, a sister of Mrs. 
Christian, and Robert Lee of 
Jacksboro.

Mr. and Mrs. Hardy Cole and 
son of Hereford visited in the 
home of Rev. and Mrs. J P. Cole 
over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wayne Rob 
erson and little daughter. Gllda 
Grace, of Grand Prairie spent 
the week end with Joe Wayne's 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Clifford 
Roberson.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Rallshack 
and little daughter o f Seymour 
and Ernest McGaughey of Abl 
lene were guests In the home of 
Mrs. Railsback and Ernest's par­
ents. Mr. and Mrs. A. K. Mc­
Gaughey.

Mr. and Mrs Johnny Bowdoin 
and little daughter of Lubbock 
visited with Johnny’s parents. 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Bowdoin. over 
the holidays.

Mr and Mrs. Jack Gibblns of 
Hobbs. N. M visited briefly w ith 
Mr* W F Rabe recently en 
route to see Mrs. Gibblns' par­
ents In Arkansas

Mrs. Fred Brown. Elizabeth 
and Floyd visited Saturday with 
Mrs Brown's grandmother in 
the J M. Burns home in Mun

REAL FOOD BUYS at Your.. . . .
Save way Food Stores

— Munday and Rochester—

★  FRIDAY and SATURDAY SPECIALS
THE FRESHEST VEGETARIsES IN TOW N!

★  Specializing in U PliV  and PEL MONTE Grands
• WITH HI (MW Pt Ki HAHK OK MOKE—

CRISCO 3 lbs. 55c
IIOKMKL With Beans BFWLEVS KM F RIBBON

CHILI tall can 2 5 c  MEAL 1 0  lbs. 6 8 c
BENTLEY'S

FLOUR i> 5  lb s r  ]L.68
it Dx>k What a Dime Buys

W.I M t r - ^

SPINACH I | 1  

BLACKEYES ■ ■  1  

TOMATOES ■ ■  1
r x i ' i u i m  «>. *1/. H E H R  m

CUT beans I V

a ' Al V IT \ < M il ORM \

PEACHES
2 1 j SIZE

24c
[ MALDORF 2 ROLLS

BATH TISSUE 13c
1 EAST TEX AS

YAMS 2  lbs. 1 3 c
1 NICE NEW

* POTATOES 2  lbs. 1 3 c
IMPERIAL C ANE

SUGAR 10 lbs. 87c
FR O H  lit NC

POKE SALAD 1 3 i
II \H K  t K*>H BANANA

c SQUASH 2 lbs. 25c
HI BY KKD IJL

GRAPEFRUIT 5<
NO. 1 Ki l l  MH LI RE

i SPUDS 10 lbs. 39c
FRESH ( HOP. NEW

ONIONS 2 lbs. 9<
FRESH SACK

: ORANGES 5 lb. bag 32c
★  IN Ol

U. 8. GOOD VEAL LOIN or

T-BONES lb. 43«
R M ARKET *

SUGAR (1  RED SLICED S U B

i BACON lb. 59c
LEAN HALT HLAB

BACON lb.41<
GOOD BIXK'K

: CHILI lb. 39c
PURE PORK SAUSAGE 
BLUE BONNET OLEO •

lb. 55c 
lb. 26c

; day.
Gerald Russell and Joe Jack- 

son of Texas Tech spent the holi­
days with their parents, the Ted 
Russels and Buster Jacksons.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Hurd and 
children of Brownfield spent the 
holiday visiting Howard’s moth­
er. Mrs. W. P. Hurd.

Lt. and Mrs. C B Stallard 
and girls of Corpus Christ! visit­
ed recently with Mrs. Stallard’s 
grandmother, Mrs Jim Rober­
son The family was en route to 
their new location at Norfolk, 
Virginia.

Mr. and Mrs. H. A. Smith and 
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Smith and 
children o f Hemphill, have been 
visiting in the Quel Hughes 

; home.
Mrs. Johnnie Parker of Wichi­

ta Falls visited Sunday In the 
Buster Jackson home

The Vera Independent Base­
ball Tam defeated the Seymour 
Independents Sunday afternoon 
with a score o f 7 to 2.

Mrs. Buster Jackson and chil­
dren, Butch, Janelle. Peggy and 
Joe visited with Mrs. Jaskson's 
mother. Mrs. N. A. Snyder of De­
Leon Sunday. Mrs. Sniifc-r accom­
panied the group home.

Friday afternoon the Vera HI 
School will be host to the Knox 
City Hi School boys District 3 
baseball contest. Tuesday, April 
27, Vera will }<mmey to Paint 
('reek to meet the Urates in a 
district game. All home games 
are being played at the Patter­
son Stadium, through the cour­
tesy of Mr. and Mr- Henry Pat­
terson.

Mr and Mrs. J. L Trainham, 
Jr., and little sons. Eric and 
Tommy, are making their home 
in Duncan, Okla. J. L. is employ- 

! ed by the Haliburton Oil and Ce­
menting Company.

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Roberson 
and Judy of Levelland have been 
visiting their parent* Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Feemster and Mr. and 
Mrs. Clifford Roberson.

Ramey Welch and Jess Train­
ham accompanied Wesley Train­
ham to Oklahoma on business 
one day last week

J Lyndal Hughe* of Justin 
stopped by the home of his par­
ents Mr and Mrs Jim Hughes. 
Friday of last week.

The many friend* of Dr J. C. 
Coffey were sorry to hear of his 
death. Dr. Coffey formerly lived 
here in Vera for a number of 
years. He was buried at Claude.

; Texas April 9th.
Holiday guests In thp home of 

i Mrs T. M. Hurd were Mr and 
Mrs. Harold Hurd and children 
of Abilene and Mr and Mrs. 
Doyle Smith of Snyder.

l o F U s
Norville Johnston, student in 

Texas Tech, was a holiday visi­
tor with his parents. Mr. and 
Mrs. Jesse l"hnston.

Mr and Mrs. I^-siie Phillips 
and daughters vt*ited relatives 
and friends in Pallas ar.1 Green­
ville over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs Gil Wyatt are 
spending this week in G’en Rose.

Mr and Mrs I>ee Isbell art- 
spending a few weeks at Mar­
lin Wells near Marlin.

Mr. and Mrs Jeff Mitchell vis- 
Heed Miss Becky Arrott and her 
family in Palo linto several days 
last week.

Mrs Marvin Reeves sjient last 
week with her daughter. Mrs 
Betsy Shytles, In Lubbock.

Mr. and Mrs Bob Jarvis and 
Mr. and Mrs la-o Guffey at 
tended the Ice Capades In Fort 
Worth last Sunday.

Activities o f The 
Colored People

The Junior Mission of West 
Beulah Baptist Church was In 
charge of a series of services be 
ginning last Thursday night, cli 
maxed by a program Sunday af­
ternoon. Rev. Franklin of Sey­
mour was guest speaker.

Easter services were observed 
at the Church of God in Christ 
Sunday night. Mrs. Aline John 
son had charge of the program 
Sunrise Easter services were 
held at the Baptist Church and 
services were also well attended 
at the Methodist Church, Rev 
W. M. Standsbury, pastor.

Last Thursday morning the 
teacher of the primary depart­
ment presented a Pict-OGraph 
demonstration of the events 
leading to the crucifixion of 

; Christ. She was assisted by two 
pupils. Etta Faye HID and Dor- 

i is Oudem
Mareellus t Johnson returned 

Monday night from Centerville. 
Texas where he attended the 

1 funeral of his brother. He was 
j accompanied by his son. M. J. 
! Johnson and brother. Ollls John- 
| son.

We were very happy over the 
magazines received this week 

1 from Mrs. J. B King

Don Coffman And 
Miss Jo Brockett 
Marry April 17th

Miss Jo Brockett, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. G. C. Brockett of 
Weinert, and Don Coffman, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Buster Coffman, 
of Goree. were united in mar­
riage Saturday. April 17, at 7:30 
p. m at the Methodist parsonage 
in Goree, with the pastor. Rev. 
Walter Hadley officiating.

The bride was attired In a 
winter white faille suit with 
navy accessories.

Their only attendants were 
Miss Joy Lemley and Alfred 
Hendrix.

The newly married couple left 
immediately after the wedding 
for a short honeymoon trip.

Mrs. Coffman Is employed at 
the Rexall Drug Store in Mun- 
day. The groom will report for 
duty In the U. S. Army at Fort 
Bliss on Thursday, April 22.

LOCALS
Miss Joyce Michels, who 1* at­

tending NTSC In Denton, spent 
the Easter holidays with her par­
ents Mr. and Mrs. Gene Michels.

Mr. and Mrs Claud Rogers 
visited relatives In Frisco over 
the week end.

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. P. V. Williams during the 
Faster holidays were Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Bill Pierce and children 
of Midland. Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Williams and children of Mid­
west City. Okla.. and Miss Char­
lotte Williams of Dallas.

Vernon Winchester, who Is at­
tending Hardin Simmons Univer­
sity, Abilene, visited his parents 
and other relatives during the
holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Luke of 
M liens ter spent the week end 
with Mr. and Mrs. Gene Michels 
and other relatives here.

Miss Matthews And 
James C. Yandell 
Marry April 15th

Miss Jonnye Carolyn Matthews 
and James Clayton Yandell ex 
changed wedding vows April 13 
In the First Methodist Church 
The Rev. Doyle Rogle conducted 
the services at 7:30 p. m.

The bride Is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. 11. D. Matthews, 
Sr., and the bridegroom is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. H. C. Yan­
dell.

Mrs. Dorman Followwill. sis­
ter of the bride, of Roswell. N. 
M., served as matron of honor. 
She was attired In a navy blue 
suit and navy accessories and 
wore a pink carnation.

The bride was lovely In white 
Imported lace over light blue taf­
feta with white accessories.

W. L. Medford of Paint Creek 
served as best man.

Mrs. Matthews is a senior in 
Munday High School and will 
graduate with her class in May. 
She was elected Queen of Mun­
day High, judged the most beau­
tiful girl, Is captain of the has 
ketball team and secretary of

the Senior class. She haa been a 
1 member of the pep squad and 
Home Ec Club for three eyars.

The groom is u 1950 graduate
of Weinert High School. He was 
captain of the football team for 
three years, captain of the bas­
ketball team one year, was all- 
district halfback for two years, 
most athletic boy for three 
years and a member of the Ag 
Club for four years.

Soft music was provided by 
Mrs. Doyle Ragle.

Mr. Matthews is employed at 
Blacklock Grocery a n d  the 
couple will make their home In 
Munday at Mrs Effle Alexan­
der's Apartment.

The couple had a short honey­
moon trip to Wichita Mountains 
in Oklahoma.

Mr. and Mrs. Rhine Kuehler 
and children of Morton visited 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 1!. P. 
Decker and Mr. and Mrs. Anton 
Kuehler. over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Herman Brown
and children of Chlckasha. Okla., 
.spent the week end with their 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. H. I* Deck­
er and Mr. and Mrs. Anton 
Brown.

. .TRY IT FOR FEATURES 
COMPARE IT FOR VALUE

Mr and Mrs Aaron Edgar 
spent the Easter week end with 
Mr. and Mrs J. 1,. Warrick and 
daughter. Joyce, in Wellington.

Mr. and Mrs. M. L. Joyce and 
Joe of Albany spent the Easter 
holidays with her mother. Mrs. J. 
B. Bowden, and other relatives, i

Mrs Etta Webb spent the week I 
end with relatives in Wichita 
Falls and Seymour.

It's beautiful I It's compact! It 
ha* more new features than 
ever before. The printwork is 
superb. It operates with ease 
and speed. Come in, let us 
show you these Quiet-riters.

Carrying case included •

IXCLUSIVES
• Miracle tab
• Simplified Ribbon Chang*'
• Super Strength Frame
e New beauty in printwork
• .a rg e r  t ile d  Cylinder
• Free! Touch Method Inttructiaa 

Booh

Budget Terms arranged.
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G oree Newsltem s^
GOREE MKT HOI »1ST MEN 
TO MEET APRIL 2«

J. W. Hamilton, superintendent Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Saei 
of schools of Seymour, will be Hampton and Mrs. E. J. Jones

his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Kodgers.

V »

the speaker for the Goree Meth 
odist Men's regular meeting,
April 26, at 7:0U p. m. at the 
Methodist Church.

• • •
Visitors with Mr. and Mrs. Er­

nest Moore Sunday were Mr. 
and Mrs. Floyd Coffman, Mr. 
and Mrs. Edwin Coffman of Lit­
tlefield. Mrs. Jim Rennegar of 
Levelland, Mr. and Mrs. Hilly F.
Moon*, Orman Moore of Wich­
ita Falls and Mr. and Mrs. J. M.
Edwards, Jr., of Seymour. ^ci.- cir mi, . ''aughter. Mrs. J. C. Daniel), re-

Mr. and Mrs. Elmo Cure and j turned with them for a few 
family of Abilene spent Easter (jayg vjs|t
Sunday with his parents. Mr. Mrs. E.' N. Miller of Abilene 
and Mrs. J. t .  Cure. spent Sunday wlth her daURh.

Mr. and Mrs. Everett Jones i ter, Mrs. Billy Hutchens, and 
and son of Fort Worth visited family

during the week end were Mr. 
and Mrs. Phillip Jones and Royce 
of Grand Prairie, Mrs. Kenneth 
Houk. Charlotte and Dwayne, of 
Littlefield and Marion Jones of 
Munday.

•Mr. and Mrs. Ira Stalcup and 
Mrs. J. M. Edwards, Sr., of Sey­
mour and Mineral Weils arid 
Weatherford visitors last Sun­
day.

 ̂Mr. and Mrs. John Hates and 
Frank Ross visited in Amarillo 
• luring the week end. Their

Goree 4-H Girls 
Entertain P.-T. A. 
Members With Tea

his mother, Mrs. G. D. Jones, 
Sunday.

Visitors with Mrs. W. S. Heard 
and Mrs. V. M. Reeves during 
the week end were Hugh, Gene 
and Dr. J. G. Heard of Houston. 
Heard and Jim Reeves and fam­
ilies of Wichita Fails.

Mr. and Mrs. Claxton Tucker 
of Lubbock spent the week end 
with their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
T. M. Tucker and Mr. and Mrs. 
J. H. Jones.

Mr and Mrs. Tlamadge Falls 
of Throckmorton spent Ktindny 

\ w ith friends in Goree.

The Goree 4-H Club girls hon­
ored members of the Goree P-TA 
at a tea recently. A bake show 
was seld preceding the tea and
following the Judging, cakes, 
cookies and punch were served 
to the guests.

Members of the 4-H Club 
greeted the guests at the door 
and directed them to the displays 
of cakes and cookies.

Judges for the show were the 
senior home economics girls.

Hlue ribbons in the cake divis­
ion were awarded to Jo Ann 
Estes. Shirley Sherman, P a t 
Hlankinship, and Sandra Land. 
White ribbons went to Ruby 
Dain Hammons, and Nanette 
Roberts.

Hlue ribbons in the cookie di­
vision wero awarded to Reba 
Tynes, Glenda Jane Lowrance, 
Jane Lawson. Hrenda Hutchens, 
and Faye Wallace. Red ribbons 
went to Nancy Patterson. Ann 
Morton and Belva Jetton. White 
ribbons went to Mary Ann Mar 
tain, Becky Jameson, Judv Hunt, 
and Beth Howry.

Mr. and Mrs. James Carver Ward Cooksey and Carol Coff 
and Mrs. Homer Moore spent the man. who are in school in Abi- 
Easter holidays with relatives in lone spent the Easter holidays 
Fort Worth. with their parents.

Mr. and Mrs. Orlis Lambeth Lynell Jetton, daughter of Mr. 
of Anton visited his parents, Mr. land Mrs. S B. Jetton, is in the 
and Mrs. R. L. Lambeth, during Seymour Hospital this week, 
the week end. -------------------

Those going to Lawton, Okla., j _  _
to attend the Easter pageant Sun I  I I  I A I  v
daw morning were Mr. and Mrs l j  vr V/ a  Li »3
Woody Roberts, Mr. and Mrs ______
Hill Wright, Mr. and Mrs. Chas. Kenneth Hendrix of Texas 
Edwards, Mrs. Amy Edwards Tech in Lubbock was a holiday 
and Mr. and Mrs. Millard Me- 1 guest of his parents, Mr. and 
Swain. Mrs. Frank Hendrix.

Misses Nanette and Jan R o b ______________
erts and Billy Frank Fitzgerald Mr. and Mrs. V. M. Lee and 
spent the Easter holidays on the son. Ronnie, of Denison were 
Pitchfork ranch near Dickens week end guests of her mother, 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. Billy Dren Mrs S. E. Robertson, and sister 
nan. Mrs. Jimmie Bullington Mrs.

J. F. Draper, who has been Ix*e and Ronnie remained for a 
quite ill for the past eight longer visit.
weeks, has improved some the ------------------
past week. Mrs Hersehell Cowan a n d

Mackey Murdock returned to daughter. Nancy, were w«*ok end 
Denton Monday after spending guests in the home of Mr. and 
the holidays with his parents. Mrs. Clyde Longbotham in Guy- 
Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Murdock. man. Oklahoma.

Mrs. J. T. Lawson left for Dal­
las this week for an extended 
visit.

Charlie Rodgers of Camp Car- 
son, Colo., and his wife and son, 
who have been in Chattanooga. Drive eareuflly. The life you 
Okla., spent the week end with I save may be your own.

L O C A L S
Mrs. Sammy Gossett of Mead­

ows and her sister. Mrs. Yan- 
dell, were Sunday guests In the 
home of Mrs. Ann McClaran.

Mr. and Mrs. Troy Warren of
Wink visited his parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. S. J. Warren, during the 
week end.

Mrs. Aline Koenig and sons. 
David and Robert, of Oklahoma 
City spent Easter with her par­
ents. Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Hovers.

Mr. and Mrs. Travis Gore 
and Mr and Mrs. Gilbert Green 
of Wiehita Falls spent the* week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
Green.

—

Services At The 
Area Churches

FRIKN1MIIIP MISSIONARY 
RAPTWT CHURCH

Sunday School--------  10:00 a m.
Preaching __________ 11:00 a. m.
U. T. S. __________  6:30 p. m
Preaching _______  7 30 p. m.
Prayer Service each Wed­

nesday night ..... . 7:30 p. m.
I .ester Blackerby, pastor 
THE CHURCH OF GOD 

welcome you to each of 
the church services, as follows: 

Sunday school. 10 a. m.; morn 
Ing worship. 11 a. m.; Sunday 
evening service 7:30 p. in.; 
prayer m e e t i n g  Wednesday, 
7:30 p. m.; young [>eople's -er 
vice. Saturday. 7:30 p. m.

Rev. C. E. Hilea. pastur.

GOREE BAPTIST CHL'RCII
10 a m . Sunday school; 11 

a m.. Preaching 
6:15 p. m.. Training Union. 

7:15 p. m., Preaching.
W. M. S. meets Monday af­

ternoons at 2:30 
Mid-week prayer service, 7 p. 

m. Wednesday.
S. E. Stevenson pastor

FIRST BAPTrsr CHURCH 
Munday, Texas

Sunday S ch ool____  10 00 A. M.
Morning Worship . .  1100 A. M.
Training U n ion ------ 6:30 P. M
Evening Worship . . .  7:30 P M 

Huron A. Polnac, pastor

BETHLEHEM PRIMmVK 
BAPTIST CHURCH

Services are being held five 
miles north of Munday.

Services at 11 a. m. Saturday 
before the second Sunday. Ser­
vices at 10:30 a. m Sunday.

Elder L. M. Handley preaches 
the third Sunday Services 

| 10:20 a. m. Sunday Singing in 
1 the evening.

Mr and Mrs. Walter Sommer 
ville of Wichita Falls and Mrs. 
M. L. Jacobs visited in Lubbock 
and the Carlsbad Caverns last 
week end.

Mr. and Mrs W. C. Cox visited 
relatives In Winnsboro over the 
holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. E. L. Goolsby 
spent the Easter holidays with 
relatives in Winnsboro.

Slaughtering
Monday - Wednesday - Friday 

WE KILL ONLY GOOD BEEF 
Buy Your Meats WHOLESALE!

Your Satisfaction Guaranteed

MUNDAY 
LOCKER PLANT

Closing Hour, 6:30 P. M.
MR. and MRS. HOLLLS B. MOORE, Owners 

JAMES R U C K  ALVIN MICHALIK
Phone 4551 Munday, Texas

Mr. and Mrs. E. R. Ponder 
M IV visitors in Abilene last
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Norris Smith vis­
ited his brother and family in 
Amarillo over the Easter holi­
days.

Bill Morris and Perry Reeves 
were business visitors in Ama­
rillo last Friday.

Perry Reeves, who is attending 
NTSC in Denton, spent the East­
er holidays with his parents, Mr.

I and Mrs. Jim Reeves.

Mr. and Mrs. Waymon Pistole 
visited relaitves in Waco and 
Hen Hur during the holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. George Heard and 
) children spent the Easter holi­
days with relatives in Ballin- 

, Rer.

PRESBYTERIAN C HURCH 
Munday. Texas

You are cordially invited to 
attend these services at the 
church:

Sunday school at 10 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11 a. m.
Rev. Bob Johansen, Pastor 

FIRST METHODIST CHURCH 
Church School 9:55 A M.
Morning Worship 10 55 A M.
Evening Worship 7:00 P.M.
Methodist Youth

Fellowship_____  8:00 P.M.
Midweek Prayer Service.

Wednesday _____  __ 7:30 P.M.
Choir Rehears.«!. Wednes 

l*y 8 00 P.M
W. S C. S. Monday 3:00 P.M.
Guild each second and fourth

Monday   7:30 P.M
Official board meetings.

Third Monday ______  7:30 P.M
Methodist Men, First

Tuesday______   7:30 P.M
Children's Fellowship 
Group, Mondays____ 2:45 P.M.

H. Doyle Ragle. Pa-tor

Royce Reddeil of Texas Tech 
in Lubbock spent the holidays 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs 
Fred Hedddel, Sr.

James Amerson, who is at­
tending NTSC In Denton was a
holiday guest o f his parents. 
Mr. and Mrs J. H. Amerson.

Little Lynell Jetton of Goree 
is In the liaylor County Hospital 
at Seymour. She Is the daugth- 
ter of Mr. and Mrs S B. Jetton.

TEN IMPORTANT FEATURES
AT YOUR SERVICE

THE BOOK
I Open at A 

Noi ‘‘Kick-Rack" Cloved
S i  Flat Open at All States

SAFETY TINT
Protection Again»! Any 
Alteration of Iteccipta

UNPAID BALANCE
Figur*» Here Cannot Conflirt 

With Thoaa of Amount Received

COURTESY FEATURE 
Helpa Create Good Will

POSTING REFERENCE

ADDRESS LINI

NUMBERING
Po«itive Identification 

Original Mith Duplicata
1 '

CASH □  CHECK □
Thi« Feature I» Worth Mara 

Than Coat of the Books

ST. JOSEPH’S CHURCH 
(CATHOIJO RHINELAND

MASSES SUNDAYS and
HOLY DAYS 

8:00 and 10:00 a. m
CONFESSIONS: SATURDAYS 

4:00 and 7:00 p. m 
Sundays before Masses 
RADIO PROGRAMS 

Christian In Action KF*DX 
Sundays 10 SO a m.
Catholic Hour WBAP Sundays 

1:00 p. m.
The Rosary KRLD Fridays 

9:45 p. m.
Anyone wishing to learn what 

we believe Is free and without ob­
ligation to inquire Christ's mess 
age of charity and love.

Rev Fabian Dierslng, O. S B.
Pastor

COLUMN FOR FIGURES
Keep« Figures in Mn« 

Totaled Accurately, Quicker

PERFORATION ONE W AY 
Eaay, Quick. Even Tear Off

COO  L E A V E S .  2 C A R B O N S  
4  R E C E I P T S  T O  E A C H  L E A P  

D U P L I C A T E  P E R M A N E N T  
R E C O R D —N O T  P E R F O R A T E D

W* HAVE THESE IN STOCK 
FOR IMMEDIATE DELIVERY

THE M U N D A Y  TIMES

CHURCH or CHRLST 
Munday, Texas 

Sunday Services:
Bible S tudy---------10:00 a. m.
Morning W orship.. 10:45 a. m 
Evening Bible Study, 6:15 p  m. 
Evening Worship _  7:00 p. m. 

Wednesday:
Bible Study---------- 7:00 p. m.

Thursday:
Ladies Bible Study. 9:00 a. m. 

Herald o f Truth 
Sunday, 1:00 p. m., KJLB.C. 

1470 kc
Clifford Wilson. preacher

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHliRCH 
310 East Main 

Knox City, Texas
Sunday School ..............10 a. ia
iTeaching  _________ l l  a. m.
C. T. F..... —  « p .  to.
Van peri ____ __________ 7 p. m

We invite you to the "Church 
With a Gospel of Love.“

Week end guests in the home 
of Mr and Mrs Joe Pierce were 
Mr and Mrs. Lush Jungman and
children of Aspermont, Mr. and 
Mrs. Harmld Mercer and child­
ren of Oklahoma City and Mr. 
and Mrs. Cleo Pearce and child­
ren of O’Donnell.

Guests In the home of Mr. and 
Mrs 'Leland Hannah during the 
Easter holidays were Mr. and 
Mrs. Troy Denham and children, 
Nancy and Terry, of Leuders, 
Mrs. Jim Choate of El Paso,

Mias Charlotte Hannah of Har 
dm Simmons University in Abi­
lene, and Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Choate o f Littlefield.

GILI.KNMK BAPTLST 
CHURCH

Sunday s c h o o l--------------- 10 a m.
Evening Worship________ 7 p. m
Morning W orship____  11 a. tn
Training Union ......... ....  6 p. m

Roger Butler, pastor

WEINEKT FOUR-NQI AKIt 
CHURCH 

Welnert, Texas
Sunday S ch ool____10:00 P M
Morning Worship 11:00 P M.
Youth S erv ices___ 6:00 P M.
Evangelistic Service, 7:00 P M
Prayer Meeting,

W ednsdav________ 7:00 P M.
Preaching Service.

Ira C. Frazier, pastor

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Cude left 
last Friday for McKinney after 
receiving word that Pat, 12 year 
old son of Mr. and Mrs. W. R. 
Black, was drowned in a tank 
near McKinney that afternoon. 
They stayed until Sunday after­
noon for the funeral. Mr and 
Mrs. Boyd Meers attended the

Mr and Mrs. Tarry 
and Mrs. Emil Hoff and 
ted Mrs. Verbon Voa 
ren and Mrs. Della 
Abilene last Sunday. Him. 
and son accompanied 
Mrs. Voss to their 
Stephenville for a visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank
and children of El Paso 
her sister and husband, 1 
Mrs. A. B. Warren, 
mother, Mrs. J. W. Medley, 
Haskell over the week «ad.

Coco n
g  D u r k e e ’ s  F a n c y  A  (anut b«« lUc I

FLOUIR 25,“  $1.69 j
I  • REGULAR 95c V A LU E ............  I

|S|UGAR 10“ '79c 1
MILIK Qt...19c hpl 37c j

1 R o a st ;r"An” 29c|
• ALL BRAND* . . .

Crac
a a

kers 1 L 17c
o l :EO “ 1 A  19 c
• NEW EVERYDAY LOW P R IC E ............

Miracle Whip 49c
BACON =r lb 59c
Velve e t a 2 » - 69c
DOMALO IH < K

Orangiî Juice vi1 ' 10c
TIDE OUR ix m  PRICE . 4  P  A -  Return Itk- COUPON In Box to 1  A

Z « ) C  U K . Coat of Tide to you . . .  . |

1 CATSUP r ,n 5c|
Bakerite 3169c
E v e r y d a y  I a >w

PREM
[’ r i c e  . . . .  A l l s w e e t

39c OLEO 25c
Melloiine «an»» 49c
BOKHKNS FVERYIH

Bisci
kY LOW P R IC E ............

uits 2 fw 19c
a WK RESERVE Til* RIGHT TO LIMIT QUANTITY • GORKI

M  S y s t e m
5 T O R E 5L" ' -J

s

/



THE MUNDAY TIMES, THURSDAY. APRIL 22. IBM

f Buy, Sell, Rent, Lease or Exchange It Through . . .

The Times Want Ads
WRECKER SERVICE—Cali us. 

day or night. Day phone. 3291; 
night phone. 3936. Call us lor 
loading service on your farm 
equipment. Munday Faint and 
Body Shop. 28-tlc

»CRATCH PADS 
perforated. Ideal 
Ten cents each 
Ttmar

liound and 
for figuring 
flu- Munday 

30-tfe

NOTICE—Anyone having bour­
ee. buildings or apartments 
for rent, please list them with 
the Chamber of Commerce of 
flee The Chamber of Com 
mem* may he of some help to 
you. as well as to those look­

ing for places to rent 42-tfc

KRAUSE PLOWS — W’e ca n  
make delivery on these plows 
In sizes from 8 te 15 feet Rog­
ers A Mann. Inc. 15-tfc

FARMERS See us for your 
machine work Russell Penici 
Equipment Company. $tf>

BETTER OULF—Gives better 
performance for your car. We 
try to give prompt attention 
to all types of automotive ser 
vice Gulf gas. oils, greases 
and those good Gulf tires. Au­
tomotive acceessories too. R. 
B. Bowden Gulf Service Sta 
don. 43-tfc

L ® ® K
Drudrulial

F A R M  
LO AN S

J  Low Irtu isst 

<J Long Tarm 

V Fair A p p rsW  

Z Prompt

J. C. Harpham

ADDING MACHINE P A P E R - 
Good stock n o w  on hand at 
The Times office. 20-tfc

By JOHN C. WHITE, Commissioner

Mrs. Beatrice King. Mr. and 
Mrs. J. A. IU11 and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gene Shackelford and 
children of Petersburg, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Cloud anti children of

Sargent and family of Guthrie, 
Mr. and Mrs. E. J Cude and Mr.
and Mrs. Lowry Wilson and 
children gathered at the park In 
Vernon for a Easter picnic nnd

Benjamin. Mr. and Mrs. .Charles j egg hunt Sunday.

WANTED Sewing to da Locat 
etl In rear of Nora s Dress 
Shop on Tuesdays and Thurs 
days. Mrs. Floyd Searoev.

36-tk

FOR SALE —10 h. p. Mercury 
Hurricane motor and 16-foot 
boat, both at bargain prices. 
Also 1949 Jeepster convertible. 
See C. T. Vinson at Munday 
Paint and Body Shop or call 
8886. 32 tic

FOR SALE Lankart 57 cotton 
seed. First year from register­
ed seed. Dellnted and sacked 
In 80 lb. bags. Clyde Yost, 2 
miles northwest of Munday.
Phone 2599. 37-6tp

4 ROOM Modern house for 
rent or sale. W. O. Mays.

' 38-2tp

MUNDAY. TKXA.1
Authorized Mortgage Loan So­
licitor for The Prudwitlal In­
surance Company of America.

I FOR SALE Sudan seed, fret* 
of Johnson grass. Phone 6682. 
H. D. Henson. 38-4tp

FOR SALE -Sweet Sudan seed. 
Joe Rellinghausen, route two 
Munday. 38-2tc

FARMERS See us for your 
machine work. Russell Penlck 
Equipment Company 3-tfr

SEPTIC TANK—Cleaning. Also 
pump out cess pools and 
storm cellars, and will clean ( 
cisterns and shallow wells Av­
erage home, $20 to $35 Work 
guaranteed one year. Phone 
2391. Box 1379. Seymour. Tex­
as. John Crawford. 23-tfc

NOTICE—Anyone calling P. V. 
Williams, the Roxy Theatre or 
the Gulf office, dial 2661

22 tie
FARMERS See us for you! 

machine work. Russell Penlck 
Equipment Company 3-tfr

RADIO REPAIRS— B r i n g  us 
your radios for repair* We 
repair any make or model 
giving you prompt service 
Strickland’s Radio Service

18-tic

WANTED Repair loans Add a
room. Venetian blinds. Ideal cab­

inets. awnings, sand floors, 
new linoleum repaper a n d  
paint, etc. Wm. Cameron A 
Co. 32 tfc

YOUR RECORDS For n e x t  
year can be accurately kepi 
with a Gamer's Farm Record 
Book. Meets all Income tax re­
quirements. For sale by The 
Munday Times. 25-tfc

WE HAVE—A nice 4 door Ply 
mouth with radio and heater 
Want to traile for tractor and 
equipment Munday I m p l e ­
ment Co. 30-tfc

WRECKER SERVICE—Call us. 
day or night. Day phone. 3291; 
night phone, 3936 Call us for 
loading service on your farm 
equipment. Munday Paint and 
Body Shop. 28-tfc

SEWING MACHINES NeccM
and Elna. the world's most ad­
vanced sewing machines. Nec 
chi. with the wonder wheel.

does 64 kinds of decorative 
stitches, and Elna, fully auto­
matic. Your dealer. Allen's 
Sewing Machine Center, toll 
call 1288, 107 N. Swenson St.. 
Stamford, Texas. 27-521p

ADDING MACHINE PAPER 
now in slock 20c cents roll 
standard size 2 5/32 In.I Mun­
day Times. 43 tfc

EXPERT Painting a n d  paper 
hanging, textoning. Call col­
lect. 2204 or 2217, Seymour. 
Texas 26-3tp-tfc

WRECKER SERVICE -Call us. 
day or night Day phone. 3291; 
night phone. 3936. Call us for 
loading service on your farm 
equipment. Munday Paint and 
Body Shop. 28-tfc

HAVE—A ton Ford pickup 
Want to trade for tractor and 

i equipment Munday Itnple
merit Co. 30-tfc

PROMPT SERVICE W -• c a a  
give two-<lsy service on radio 
or television set repairing Lrt 
us serve you. Richmond Jewel 
ry 43-tfc

FOR SALE — l-ankard cotton 
seed First year from register­
ed seed- Same as blue tag. J. 
L  StudghiU. 29-tic

41 )W IN STUCK Speedb«D vt.» 
Katrrbr*>ok f o u n t a i n  pwna. 
Scrtpto pencil». Columbia arm 
file*. thumb tack», p a p e i 
punches, etc See our line ot 
office supplies The Munday 
Times 13-tfc

i HAVE A good 1’» ton Chevro­
let truck with grain bed. Want 
to trade for tractor and equip j 
ment. Munday Implement Co.

! 3o tfc

FYIR SALE—Electrolux Vacuum 
Cleaners, sales, service, parts. 
W. H. McDonald Seymour 
Phone 2649 26-tfc

I AM HANDLING — Cottonseed 
I for the Goree Gin and have a 

variety of all field seeds. 
Come in and see me for all 
your feed and seed needs. 
Barger Feed and Seed. Goree. 
Texas. 38-3t|>

FOR SALE Common sudari 
seed, first year from certified 
seed Call George Wall at 
3031. 38 2b

SEE MVXCIK
FOR SALE 87 acres of land 

about five miles o f Munday 
5150.00 per acre R M. Alman- 
rode 38 2tc
LIMITED TIME ONLY To 

good credit risks, we can sell a 
new 195-1 model Jubilee Ford 
tractor for as low as $475 
down. You can pay the balance 
out of the next 3 Fall crops. 
It costs you nearly this much 
to keep up old equipment. 
Munday Implement Co. 38-tfc

NOTICE—Rock for Irrigation 
wells. $6 per yard delivered or
$5 per yard at my home. Also 
gravel. $3 per yard; driveway 
gravel. $2 50 per yard: dirt. 
$1 per yard delivered In Mun­
day. Phone 2191. A. E. (Sappy) 
Bowley. 28-tfc

FOR SALE 4 r o o m  frame 
house. Joe B. Roberts, phone 
2596 23 tfc

i FOR KENT 4 room house. See 
J W Gaither 39 3tp

FI *R RENT Two bedroom mod­
em house with living room, 
dining room and kitchen furn 
ed Couple only. Supt. Bryan 
Lawson. Goree, Texas 393tp

FOR RENT Two bedroom fur­
nish«! garage apartment. 12« 13 j 
15th Avenue Phone 3941 ltc

L O C A L S

KHI YEARS OF INSECT 
CONTROL PROGRESS

ITIniltlve "Swat That Fly" 
campaigns are now as outdated 
as the buggy whip

Today, scientists are calling on 
the awesome power of atomic 
energy to help fight man's per 
petual battle against the Insects.

Using atomic energy as a tool 
to learn the secrete of insect* 
is an ultra modern development. 
Researchers believe It can help 
them determine insect resistance 
to insecticides and reveal the 
cause* of Insect outbreaks. This 

j new step comes on the 100th 
birthday of insect research In 
the United States

The science of entomology be­
gan serving the public in 1854 
when New York State and the 
Federal government each em­
ployed an entomologist. Dr. Asa 
Fitch focused his attention on 
New York’s insect |>roblems and 
Townsend Glover originated Fed­
eral research on pests of cotton 
and citrus fruits.

Since that time, more than 
10.000 species of Insect pests 
have been the targ«’t of entom­
ologists. The fight has involved 
research, quarantine and active 
area wide control efforts.

Among the major accomplsh- 
ments can be listed the suecesful 
campaigns against house flies i 
and mosquitoes that began about I 
1900, A “ Swat That Fly" pro j 
gram started that year had J 
much to do with the present 90 
per cent decrease In the number 
of typhoid cases, one of the 
many diseases carried by flies.

Serious efforts to control mos­
quitoes began when medical men 
learned the connection between 
diseases and Insects As a re­
sult of entomological and medi­
cal efforts, there has been no 
outbreak of yellow fever in the 
United States since 1950.

Food-wise, the codling moth 
that once took 50 percent of the 
apple crop now gets less than 
5 percent of the U S production 
because of the development and 
application of methods to con­
trol it And 80 ye.-trs ago. the 
Colorado beetle destroyed a ma­
jor portion of the crop over wide 
areas. Arensica! dusts were first 
use to control this pest, and since 
1946. modern Insecticides and in­
sect control methods have In- 

; creased potato production per 
acre by about 50 i«ercent.

One of the promising new 
fields opening up today Is that 

1 of systemic nsecticides chemi­
cals capable of being carried by 
the sap of plants, and the blood 
streams of livestock. When this 
Is perfected, they we really will 
be living, relatively speaking. In 
a "modern age of miracles.”

INSURANCE
M)ANS on

FARMS and RANC HES

J. C. BORDEN AGENCY
First National Hank Building 

MUNDAY —Telephone 4241— TEXAS

Irĵ v* u
M iM tn, m orr |M»|>ular than evrr. 
H err, a Heal a ftern oon  iIiy m  in r«it- 
lt»ii «Iriiini i» ilfu ign fil with r«M$t 
linn». \ white p«<|ur collar ami hig 
roiim l hiittiMi* accent the coat «Irr**, 
• »or o f  a fash ionab le  ftnKip o f  midi* 
m er «Im iin* ilnMgnr«l Irr Me|than$a 
h öre t o f  lla lifoetiia .

L O C A L S
Robert Gray came In last week 

from Kelly Field. San Antonio, 
on a thirty day furlough and Is
visiting his parents, Mr and Mrs 
Hoyt Gray.

Farm Supplies
★  CANVAS IRRIGATION 

PIPE
★  CANVAS DAMS
★  LISTER SHARES
★  HOG FEEDERS

See Our Self-Propelled ALL-CROP  
HARVESTER

Reid’s Hardware
Munday, Texas

Miss Julie Massey spent the 
Easter holidays hen* with her 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Joe Mas­
sey. Miss Massey is a student in 
McMurry College, Abilene.

Miss Joyce Michels, student at 
NTSC in Denton. was a holiday 
visitor here with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Michels.

Mr. and Mrs. Orville Wilson 
and son of Fort Worth visited 
his mother. Mrs. W. W. Wilson 
during the holidays.

f
\

I I
I \

' i 
I I 

I I 
I I 
I I

Go outside and look
at you r house
RIGHT NOW!

KM ^l m/s
WHAT IT MHOS ?

Sunday guests of Mr and Mrs 
W. E Reynolds wen* Mr. and 
Ralph Watkins and daughter. 
Renee, and Mrs R W. Watkins 

i of Wichita Falls,

Mr ami Mrs Carl Gage.Tnm- 
| my am! Helen Beth, visited the 
Gage's daughter in Dallas and 
relatives In Stephenville over the 
week end

OA/ty
time to 

I against
thing the weather can
a t . . .  with the kind at p a in i  
that has what It taka*. That’s SWF 
otad to talk beck to the weather'

s5.95
Paint now with 8WP . . . have the beet-looking 
house in your neighborhoo

Mildly Lumber

Current
Dividends

50%
( ALL COVERAGE) 

On AilUmutMlm Insured 
with

Southern Farm 
Bureau Casualty 

Insurance Co.

Contact your agent for the 
advantages o f Farm Bureau 
life, automobile and Are In­
surance

H. T. Cardwell, Jr.
(I/Orated, Chamber of 

(ommerre Office)

Our Plant 
IN OPER ATION
Our cottonseed d e 11 n 11 ng 

■lant is now In operation. We 
ire ready to clean and treat 
your planting seed.

Ivlinted and treated cotton­
seed pays best. Bring us your 
seed at your earliest conven­
ience. or see us for booking 
date

JACKSON 
Delint ing Co.

—PHONE 3771—

COMPIT I PLANT F000

(Spreaders Available)

ATKEISON’S 
Food Store

"COME 7D Th MK OF iT. HOW DOES TdiS MAIL ORDER CATALOG 
KNOW WHAT Size AN 'AU£RHG£ SJZ£ KJTCHEH' I f ? "

We Sell! We Install! W e Service! We G uarantee! 
Always Call This PLUMBING CONTRACTOR

JAMES W . CARDEN
I'lunibing, Electric, Heating and Air Conditioning 

rilONK 4431 811 isth AVENUE
Dealer RUTH BERRY—World’s Finest Water Rumps

f . e . T S W .  r '-’s f  i •* ; - ' N

a#««““  t

4  ^

Stop Taking 
Harsh Drugs for 
Constipation

Avoid Intestinal Uput! 6ft Relief This 
Gentle Ve|etaWe Uxatlv* Way!

For constipation, am  take harsh drugs. 
They (»use brutal cramp» sod griping, 
disrupt normal bowel sction, make re­
peated dotes seem needed

When you are temporarily consti­
pated, get rnn hut pntU relief— without 
salts, without harsh drug* Tike Dr 
Caldwell's Seims lautive contained in 
Syrup Pepatn. The «tract of Senna ia 
Dt. Caldwell t is ear #/ jke futss wt.rW 
(anaiia  known to medtdae.

Dr. Caldwell's Senna Laxauee tastes 
good, giees gentle, omfortabic, satis 
(ring relief of temporary constipation 
foe eeery member of the family. Help« 
you get “on schedule" without re­
peated dot«. Eeen reheees stomach 
sourness that constipation often beings.

Buy Dr. CaldsreH'i, Money back if 
no« satiafied MtiJ bottle so Boa 2WI. 
New York it, N Y.

YOU’l l  CHOOSE THE

JOHN DEERE NO. 55

' • *

;*v- , f-*--/4
•' -  . *\BfiGBi v'.. dÊmsmt

Just watch the John Deere No. 55 eat up 
(he acres o f  wheat, flax, barley, rice, maize, 
hcans or any other comhineahle crop. Then 
compare it, ftatmrt for f t  atm re, with other 
sell-propelled combines and you'll agree 
. . . it's the choice o f  the held.

The No. 55 is a dependable combine 
that saves on every job  . . .  in grain, in 
man-hours, in tractor power. It’s fast 
and economical . ,  . cleans up the harvest

fields in a hurry.
Such features as the big-capacity, by- 

draulirally-controUed It foot p l a t f o r m ;  
variable-speed V-beIt drive; heavy-duty. 
30-inch rasp-bar cylinder; efficient separat­
ing cylinder; all-steel straw walkers; auger 
unloading grain lank; powerful Hercules 
engine; convenient controls; high, roomy 
platform, and many others assure a prof­
itable harvest for you. See us for details.

HARRELL'S MOTOR 
& EQUIPMENT

709 Sixth Avenue Munday, Texas

JOHN DEERE... Qua&jy /V<ukc ca5* 1̂d/i*K'
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i e r s  t a l k

LIVESTOCK
b y  rev g o

STRONG DFMAND FOR 
CATTLE CONTINUES—

FORT WORTH Movement of 
cattle to markets over the na­
tion on Monday was again fur 
behind a week earlier and also 
the same date a year ago. This 
same situation enabled most 
classes of cattle and calves to 
hold onto gains established at 
Fort Worth earlier when rains 
drenched the bulk of the West­
ern and Northwestern counties.

Stocker d e m a n d  remained 
strong on the kinds with quality. 
Some packers complained canner 
and cutter prices were at unreal­
istic heights but could accom- 
lish little when a downward ad­
justment was tried.

Creepfed calves again topped 
at $18 to $22 freely and the med­
ium and lower grades sold from 
$17.50 downward to $10 to $11 
for culls. Medium and good 
Stocker steer calves and yearl­
ings drew $1G to $20. and indica­
tions were numerous that load 
lots of strictly choke steer calv­
es could bring $22. Replacement 
cows drew $10 to $14.

Fed cattle were pretty scarce 
again, with some good kinds at 
$18 to $23. odd head (0 $24.
Others drew $13 to $17.50. Fat 
cows cleared at $11 to $15. jt load 
from Kirk Edwards. Clay Coun­
ty, was representative of the top 
at $15 and they weighed 1.170 
Ihs. Canners and cutters drew 
$8 to $11, a few shells below $H, 
some canners from the JA Ranch 
drew $9.75.

drew $23 to $25.50, while the 
medium and lower grade scaled 
from $10 to $13 on culls to $15 
to $22 on common to medium kill­
ers. The market was steady to 
50c higher on the class, the top 
lambs were $2 to $2.50 above 
the low time eight days earlier. 
Shorn fat lambs of good and 
choice kinds sold for $20 to $22 
or 50c to $1 higher. Cull, com­
mon and medium shorn lambs 
drew $9 to $18. Stocker and feed 
er lambs drew $15 to $20.

Yearlings and two-year-olds 
sold from $14 to $16.50. Old weth­
ers cashed at $9 to $12.50. 
Slaughter ewes sold for $5 to $7. 
Old bucks bulked at $4 to $5.

Some very good quality solid 
mouthed ewes went out as breed 
ers for $12.50, and some young­
er ewes with quality went to the 
range at $14 to $15.

HOGS HIT ANOTHER 
NEW SEASON HIGH—

The short hog crop was re­
flected again by curtailed re­
ceipts at all points and higher 
prices Monday. Top at Fort 
Worth was $28 to $28.50, or 
steady to 50c higher. Sows were 
also fully steady to strong at $22 
to $24. a few to $24.50.

BENJAMIN NEWS
(Mrs. Von R. Terry, Cor.)

Legal Notice
Miss Bertha Phillips, M rs 

Ivorl Phillips and Mrs. Paul 
Yoakum of Odessa visited in the 
home of Mrs. Fred Brown and 
other friends here one day last 
week.

Visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Claude Jennings and 
fumlly Friday and Sunday were 
Mr. und Mrs. Cedi Smith and 
family of Clovis, New Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. W. M. llertel and 
Gary were in Galveston last 
week on business and also visit­
ed in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Skidmore and girls in 
Houston.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Herndon 
and girls of Houston and Mrs. 
W. H. Littlepage of Knox CM} 
were week end visitors In the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Clarence

Mr. and Mr*. Bert Swaner and 
daughter* of Snyder were week 
end visitor* of her mother, Mrs.
Myrtle Meinzer.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Cash and 
sons of Gilliland transacted bus­
iness here Saturday.

Mr. and Mr*. Brady Wampler I 
and family attended a family re-
union In the home of Mr. and * petition at or 
Mrs. Earl Wampler and family 
in Lorenzo last Sunday.

Mrs. Opal Harrison and Shar­
on spent the week end In Lub­
bock and Lorenzo with her 

I daughters, Helen and Evelyn, 
and attended a family reunion in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Wampler In Lorenzo. Helen re 
turmnl home with her mother, 
for a visit after receiving her 11 
cense from
Lubbock. ., __ . .

Mrs. D. V. Gilbert and daugh ,n* No ^  nam<*8 of ,he
ters and O. V. Chitty transacted

CITATION BY PUBLICATION
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

To: LAURA LAND, Greeting:
I You are hereby commanded to 
appear and answer the plain- 

before 10 
rst Monday

! after the expiration of 42 days 
from the date of Issuance of 
this Citation, the same being 
Monday, the 31st day of May, A 
D., 1954, at or before 10 o ’clock 
A. M„ before the Honorable Dis 

j trict Court of Knox County, at 
the Court House In Benjamin, 
Texas.

Said plantiff’s petition was fil­
ls beauty college in onJ he 14' h day of April 1954.

The file number of said suit be-

business In Knox City Friday 
Mr. and Mrs. Connie Gray

L O C A L S
Miss Shirley Yost, student in ' 

NTSC In Denton, visited her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Yost, 
over the holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Patterson. 
Sr., visited relatives in Brown- 
wood over the week end.

Miss Ilene McClaran of Wichl 
ta Falls spent the week end hen* 
with her mother, Mrs. Ann Mc­
Claran.

of Dumas spent the week end 
with her parents. Mr. and Mrs.
Walter Hertel. other relatives 
and friends.

Walter Birney of As|>ermont 
filled the pulpit at the First 
Christian Church Sunday in the
absence of Karle Dcsgrango. who 
was conducting a meeting in As- 
permont. Desgr.mge returned 
home Sunday night.

Miss Vera McGaughey o f Den 
ton spent the week end with her worth, 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Merlek 
McGaughey. and son.

LAMBS STAGING 
STRONG COMEBACK—

The better than 10.000 sheep 
and lambs at Fort Worth Mon­
day did not deter the salesmen 
in their fight to win back lost 
ground during the ten days be­
fore Easter when sheep and 
lamb prices broke drastically.

On Monday at Fort Worth 
good and choice Spring lambs

Mr. and Mrs. Jack McCall and 
daughter. IX-bble. and Mrs. Rose 
Jones of Grapevine were visitors 
in Munday over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Maddox 
and children of Oklahoma City. 
Okla., were guests of her father. 
M. T. Chamberlain, over the 
week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Williams 
and Mrs. Roy Jones of Wichita 
Falls were business visitors here 
last Monday.

Air Conditioners
and SUPPLIES

★  All Sizes in Stock i f

We also have two-speed pumps a n d 
floats and aspin wood packs for repack­
ing your present cooler.

Let us figure with you before you buy.

GUINN TIN & PLUMBING
Munday, Texas

Day Phone Night Phone
4301 2846

Littlepage and Mr; jack Ship and £  MVP°n an^ .Mrman and Mrs. Wilburn West and fam-
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Hendrickson }>* ot Li,mef  wen' week *nd vis- 

and daughters and Miss Ruth ‘ *ors Par,*nU- Mr and
Johnson of Wichita Falls and “**rs- »-ouls Parker.
Mrs. Helen Alexander of Cali Mrs Myrtle Meinzer transact 
form.i wen- Sunday visitor* of *d bu*ln*oa ta Knox City on*day 
Mr. and Mrs. I^wrence Johnson 
and family.

Kenneth Isbell of Abilene 
spent the Easter holidays with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ed Is­
bell. and family.

Miss Jean Galloway of Spur 
and Mr. And Mrs. Kenneth Wat­
kins of Muleshoe were week end 
visitors of their pa re nst, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. L. Galloway, other rela­
tives and friends.

Visitors in the home of Mr 
and Mrs. Noah Gtlk'ntine and 
family over the Easter holidays 
were Mr. and Mrs. (>. J. Beeler 
of Ralls. Mr. and Mrs. Harry El­
liott and girls of Houston. Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Gillentine and fam­
ily of California and Lloyd Gil- 
Inetine of Highspire. Pennsyi 
vania.

Visitors in the home of Mrs.
Nancy Hamilton over the week 
end were Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Hamilton of Chlllicotho, Mr. and 
Mrs. L. V. Hamilton and daugh­
ter of Goree, Mr and Mrs. Iva 
Hamily of Fort Worth and Bob­
by Jack Hamilton of Amarillo.

Mrs. E. A. Darwin and sons 
of Lubbock visited her parents.
Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Patterson, 
last week. The Pattersons accom 
panied Mrs. Drawin and sons to 
Fort Worth to spend the Easter 
holidays there.

Stanton Brown of Texas A&M 
College spent the week end with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. l^ovell 
Brown, and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Steadman 
and family of Fort Worth s|H-nt 
the week end with her parents.
Mr. and Mrs. J D. Red wine and 
son.

Visitors in the home of Mrs.
W. A Barnett. Pete and Omitene 
over the Faster holidays were.
Mrs. VV. D. Holloway and chil­
dren of Baytown. Mr. and Mrs.
Tom Porter. Sr. of Seymour.
Mr. and Mrs. Homer Howard ot 
Goree and Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Joiner and hoys of Lubbock.

Mr and Mrs Murry Rodgers 
and daughter of clairmont were 
week end visitors of her par 
ents. Mr and Mrs. Howard Barn­
ett and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Freddie Cren­
shaw and family were in Knox 
City Monday night of last w«-»-k.

parties In said suit are: MACK 
LAND as Plaintiff, and LAURA 
LAND as Defendant.

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to-wlt: 
Suit for divorce on the grounds 
of cruel treatment, and insup- 
portability.

Issued this the 14th day of 
April. 1954.

. . . Given under mv hand and seal
Mr and Mrs Bill Bob Glenn f  m W Court, at o r c e  in Ben­

jamin, Texas, this the 14th d<jy

Air. and Mrs. Bobby Barton | Charles Finch and Miss Peggy
and children and Bonner Barton | Clough of Arlington were guesta
of Pecos were holiday guests in the home of Mis* Clough's
with her mother, Mrs. Dessie parents, Mr. and Mrs. Dee
Fields, and other relatives. 'Clough, over the week end.

of April. A. D.. 1954.
OPAL HARRISON. 

Clerk. District Court. Knox 
County. Texas.

(SEAL» 38-4tc

GRAIN STORAGE BINS
We can sell you a grain bin to store 

your* grain, with four years to pay. They 
will pay for themselves.

TRACTOR REPAIRS-
We a r e  operating a tractor repair- 

shop. Let us do some of your repair work.

Reid’s Hardware
MUNDAY, TEXAS

Mrs. Joe Combs and daughter. 
Cindy, have returned to their 
home in Artesla. N. M., after a 
three weeks visit with her par­
ents. Mr. and Mrs D. E. Whit-

L O C A L S
Mr and Mrs. Lee Haymes vis­

ited Mr. and Mrs Mac Haymes 
and family In Odessa, his sister 
Mrs. C. D Hopkins, and family 
In Artesia. N. M 
O'Donnell and Mr and Mrs Don 
Darnell in Roswell, S' M . sever 
al days last week Mrs. Darnell 
Is the former Jane Holloway.

Mrs J. O. Tynes left last Sat­
urday for a visit with relatives 
In Springtown and Fort Worth.

Mr. and Mrs K W. Brown of 
Vernon were Sunday guests in 
the home of their son, Bob. and 
family.

Donald. Bobby and Dickie Wa­
hls brother in heed of Lubbock spent the East 

er holidays with their father. 
Sled Waheed

Mrs F. I.. Bow ley visited with 
her sister and husband. Mr. and 
Mrs. George Barnes. In Bangs 
over the week end

Mr. and Mrs | O Toggle ard 
daughter. Sand' "f Wayside vis­
ited her sister Mrs Dee Molli-

Mrs. Leslie Trimmier a n d  
(Laughters of Arlington were 
week end guests in the home of 
her sister, Mrs. Clarice Mitchell, 
and Annette.

Mr. and Mrs. Karl McNeill and 
daughters spent the week etui 
with relatives in Fort Worth and
Dallas. They attended the Ice Ca

can. and his parents Mr and padee while In Fort Worth. 
Mrs. Ben Tuggle >ver the week 
end.

Mr. and Mr Richard Kirkland 
and son of J *rt Worth were 
week end guests In the home of 
her parents Mr. and Mrs, Ben 
Toggle M> md Mrv Toggle re 
turned home with them for a 
few weeks \ Lsit.

Mr. and Mrs. B. J. llenslee >*f 
Dallas vis,!.-! their parents Mr. 
ond Mrs Fd \Vhlttemere :ri 1 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Henslee. over 
the week end.

Mr and Mrs. L. M. Patters >n 
returned me Munday fn-m 
Fort Wort! where Mrs patt -r 
son underwent surgery on I er

You Are Cordially Invited
To Attend the

SPRING SHOWING
of the

1954 Frigidaire 
A p p lian ces

Tuesday, April 27, 2 to 9 p. m.

At Our Munday Office

West Texas Utilities Company
Munday, Texas

arm in the <♦. Joseph’s Hospital

SeÁaol atccC
B0STITCH Personal Stapler

3 machines in 1
•  A Desk Fastener
• A Hand Stapler

Eva ry  Student should have one
tO  e e -  ATTACH MPHtS SICUR ELY;

— FASTEN BOOK COVERINGS;
-B IN D  THKMIS INTO COVERS;
-TACK  UP PICTURES AND BANNERS} 
-SEAL LUNCH BAGS;
-  FOR HUNDREDS OF EVERY-DAY USES.

Easy to use on desk or in the hsnd. Compact to carry in beg 
or pocket. Built by Bostitch for years of use. A really good

, fog only 2.95

Yours . . .
for "Quality Harvest

NOW SELF-PROPELLED

n

The Munday Times

THE ALL-CROP HARVESTER
Como in. Wo want you to see the new Model "100" 
Self-Propelled ALL-CROP Harvester — the machine 
that delivers grain dean for “quality harvest” — with 
9- or 12-foot header capacity all the way through.

It’s got that Allia-Chalmers “ Plus" ability — backed 
by years of experience as the acknowledged sales and 
performance leader among builders of “ six-foot and- 
under”  combines.

Now time-tested features such as Wide-How feed, 
Spiral Cylinder Bar, Rubber-Faced shelling surfaces, 
Air Bloat separation are yours — on a Self-Propelled 
— priced so it pays to own one.

X U -O O f I, •> Am, Owl— n  M — «.

NSC —  l*» ry  SatvrSay
(  OUlSCHflLM iRS A
V  ■ satis SNO Slavics y

Reid’s Hardware
Monday, Texas

.. .Tk Cm 
Jumped Ovet

•Th* o * iro | i cast of a 
kilowatt-hour of oloctlic 
torvko for rotidontial uso 
is 72% LESS than H was 
In 1944

"A n d  the Dish ran away with the spoon . ,  
Ye*, the prices o f  ev ery th in g  have been 
running away with us.

• TNI COST Of LIVING IS SET HIGH 
• THI COST Of GOVIRNMiNT IS SKY HIGH

• THI COST Of DOING 1US1NISS IS SKY HIGH

But me? —  Why, Mr. and Mrs. Customer —  
despite tremendous increases in the cost o f  
producing e lectr ic  pow er m y w age fo r  a 
k ilow att-h ou r o f  e le ctr ic  service in W est 
Texas homes is lower than ever —  *in fact, 
its 2 2 %  LESS than it was in 1944. What else 
is cheaper now than it was 10 years ago!

BE MODERN . . . L I V E  ELECTRICALLYI

T Z U d i TU U m m *

W cstTexas Utilities
Company

v
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Highlights
In ‘Quo Vadis", Metro-Gold- 

— wyn Mayer has produced a film 
that is destined to become a mo­
tion picture milestone. 

f  With Robert Taylor and Deb­
orah Kerr heading its cast of 

| thousands, this thrilling story of
the birth of Christianity in a pa­
gan world is brought to the 
screen with magnificent splen­
dor Etched against the most 
spectacular of all of history’s 

\ backdrops, that of ancient
Rome in the days of the Emper­
or Nero, this is the story of a 
handsome warrior and a beauti­
ful girl who find their love is 
matched by their devotion to a

• cause which becomes a crusade
• against man's inhumanity to 

man.
It is based on the novel by 

Henryk Sienkiwicz, which head­
ed the best seller lists for twen­
ty-five years after its first publi­
cation in 1895 and which has 
been translated into every lang­
uage in the world. It was filmed 
entirely in Rome amid the actual 
scenes of its historic locale. Its 
spectacular scen?s required more 
sets including a reproduc­
tion of the Circus of Nero and 
the filming of the burning of 
Rome; more actors (6.500 In one 
scene alone); more costumes 
(15,000 >; more props (150.000 >; 
more cast principals (110 actors 
in speaking roles); more ani­
mals (Including 63 lions) than 
any motion picture ever made.

So that “Quo Vadis" could be 
brought to the screen In Techni­
color (the first such ever made 
in Italy', more than 250 tons of 
electrical equipment was shipped 
from Hollywood to Italy.

Robert Taylor, most recently 
seen in “Westward the Women” 
and “Devil's Doorway.” plays his 
most colorful role as the Roman 
warrior, Marcus Vlnicius. Debor­
ah Kerr, last seen in “King Solo­
mon's Mines." enacts the lovely 
Lygia. Leo Genn and Peter Ustin­
ov, both prominent in the Eng

, lish theatre, are cast respectively 
as I’etronius and Nero, with 
other important roles enacted by 

| Patricia Laffan, as Poppaea; Fin­
lay Currie, as Peter; Abraham 
Sofaer. as Paul; Marina Berti 
as Eunice; and Buddy Baer, for­
mer heavyweight champion con­
tender, as Ursus, the giant who 
wrestles a ferocious bull.

“Quo Vadis'' was directed by 
Meryn LeRoy, who has given the 
screen such notable pictures as 

| "Waterloo Bridge". "Random 
Harvest,” “ Madame Curie" and 
"Little Women.” It was produced 
by Sam Zimballst following his 
successful production of "King 
Solomon's Mines."

Mr and Mrs. E. J. Cooperand 
I children of Elmer. La., have re- 
' turned home after visiting her 
mother, Mrs. Emily Carden, and 
other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Jess Crowder 
and Jim Forman of Wichita 
Falls spent the week end with 
Mrs. Crowder's mother, Mrs 
Emily Carden, and other rela­
tives. Mrs. Carden had all of her 
children together on Easter

Out-of-town guests in the home 
of Mrs. Frank Lowrance during 

¡the Easter holidays were Mr. and 
Mrs. E. H. Lowrance and chil­
dren, Freddie and Patty Kay.. 
Mr and Mrs. T. V. Lowrance 
and son, Bobby, all of Pampa. 

land two granddaughters. Marsha 
and Linda Love o f Borger.

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Barton of 
Pecos and Mrs. Henry Mason of 
Wichita Falls were guests in the 
home of Mr and Mrs. H. A. Pen­
dleton during the holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Bryant. 
Jr., and children of Iowa Park 
were guests of her parents. Mr 
and Mrs R. H. Howell, over the 
week end.

Mrs. Mae Couch and sons vis 
i ited friends In Hobhs. N. M 
! over t he week end.

DANCE---
SATURDAY, April 24th

★  ★  RAY CHANEY +  *
and His

R a n c h  H a n d s
★  *  ROUNDUP H ALL *  *

Stamford, Texas

Important
Notice

to FARMERS
We have sold over 7"> n e w Jubilee 

Ford Tractors, and we have never been 
into the motor on one yet!

It is a long lifed, trouble free, powerful 
ti-actor!

For a limited time, to good credit risks 
we can sell this new tractor for as low 
as , , .  •

$475 Down
. . . .  and give you three Fall crops to pay 
the balance.

Munday Impl. Co,
Dial 3631

Munday’s Housing 
(¿roup Answers 
Public Questions

Q Is Low Rent Public Hous­
ing a new program?

A No. It has been in opera­
tion for more than fifteen years 
and 34 housing authorities in the 
Southwest have approximately 
ten years or more experience 
with the program.

Q Does Low-Rent P u b l i c  
Housing clear the slums?

A—Most of the projects built 
by the 2-1 housing authorities in 
the Southwest were on slum 
sites and about half ot the sub 
standards units eliminated wen- 
on the sites of these original 

(projects. T h e  balance were 
I eliminated elsewhere in these clt- 
| ies by demolition or by cotnpul 
| sory repair.

Q Are th e  projects being 
I built on slum sites also”

A Most of them are not. High 
I land and improvement costs to­
gether with a critical housing 
shortage have made It necessary 

' or desirable for most authorities 
to build at least the first pro­
jects on vacant land.

Q When a family moves Into 
a Low Rent Project does it stay 

1 there forever?
A Nearly 90 percent of all the 

original tenants h a v e  moved 
from the low-rent projects In the 
Southwest and an average of 
nearly four families ha« occupied 
every low rent unit. Tills means 
that In many instances that fam 
¡lies are able to better themselves 
and move out because of the ad­
vantage o f better housing.

Mr and Mrs Don L. Ratliff 
and son. Tommy, of Dallas visit­
ed relatives and friends here last 
Thursday and Friday.

L O C A L S
Mrs. Fred Broach, Jr., and Syl 

via wen* Wichita Falls visitors 
last Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Marchel Naueit 
spent Easter Sunday with his 
parents In Stamfonl.

Week end guests In the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. E  F. Yeager 
ami family were Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Yeager and family. Mr. 
and Mrs. Hill Wynn and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Nelson and Carolyn 
all of Fort Worth.

Guests In the home of Mrs. G. 
R. Elland during the Easter hol­
idays were her daughters and 
families, I)r. and Mrs. Jim Walk 
er and children of Fort Worth 
and Mr. and Mrs. Jim Crammer 
and children of Lamesa.

Mr. and Mrs. J. O. Norvill of 
Lubbock were Sunday guests In 
the home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. B. O. Norvill. *

Mr. and Mrs. Glyn Bilbrey and 
daughter. Cathy, of Bracken- 
ridge visited relatives here anil 
at Goree over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Beecher 
and children of Dinunltt visited 
relatives here over the week end.

Mrs. Bob Rogers and children of 
Azle, Mr. and Mrs. John Earl 
Nelson and children, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. E. Hunter and children 
and Mr. and Mrs. Weldon Floyd 
and children.

Miss Ann Nelson of Dallas 
spent the Easter holidays with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Nelson.

daughter, who had been visiting 
there the past two weeks, return­
ed home with them.

Miss Patsy Morrow o f Abilene 
visited her mother. Mrs. Freddie 
Morrow, during the holidays.

Mrs. G. R. Eiland left the first 
of this week for a visit with her
brother. Bert Edwards, In Den 
v er, Colorado.

Mr and Mrs. Sidney Winches­
ter attended the Texas-Oklahoma 
Hereford Association banquet in 
Wichita Falls last Tuesday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Elliott 
and Mr. and Mr» Wayne Mitch­
ell attended the annual Easter
pageant In Oklahoma Inst Sun­
day.

Mrs. Burns Ashley of Mans 
field spent the Easter holidays 
with her parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Claud Hill. She returned home 
with Mr. Ashley, who visited 
here on Monday.

Tommy Gage, who Is attend 
ing McMurry College In Abilene 
spent the Easter holidays with 
his parents Mr and Mrs Carl 
( ’«age.

Let* Bowden of McMurry Col 
lege. Abilene, was a guest in the 
home of his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs I,evi Bowden, during the
holidays.

Miss Shirley Hill came on last 
Wednesday for a visit with her 
parent' Mr. and Mrs I,. J. Hill, 
over the Easter holidays.

Might tie a good time to carry 
out the Spring clean up and 
p.unt up program. Dry weather 
has slowed field work and spruc­
ing up the place will utilize 
available labor.

Hilton Stubblefield, student In 
NTSC In Ik*nton visited his par­
ents. Mr and Mrs. H B. Stub­
blefield, over the Easter holi­
days.

Mr and Mrs. Rex Howell and 
children spent the week end 
with her sister. Mrs. C. S Boat- 
on. ami family in Pampa and her 
mother, Mrs J. L  Bain, in Clar­
endon.

Tommy Powell, student In 
West Texas State College in Can­
yon. spent the Easter holidays 
here with his parents, Mr and 
Mrs BUI Spelce

Miss Ann Atkeison o f  Fort 
Worth was a week end guest 
with her parent- Mr and Mrs 
Dick Atkeison.

Mrs. Warren Rlster and chil 
dren visited relatives in San An­
gel«« and Mr. Rister In Sanator­
ium over the week end.

Week end guests in the home 
of Mr. and Mr' V E. Moore 
were Mrs. Ruby Culwell of 
Wichita Falls. Mr and Mrs. Roy 
Cuthirth. Mr. and Mrs. Marion 
Whitehead and Mr' T. C. Low­
ry. all o f Abilene. Mrs. Lowry 
remained for a longer visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Gaines, 
both students In NTSC in Den­
ton, spent the Easter holidays 
with his parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
J. R. Gaines.

Sunday guests In the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. R. E. Foshee were 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Foshee and 
daughter lamia, of Graham. 
Mrs A 11. Adams. Mrs. Bernle 
Adams and Mrs. Billy West, all 
of Seymour, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Adams.

Mrs. S. B. Jackson of Lubbock 
visited in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. John E. Jackson the first 
o f this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Sharp and 
daughter. Kay. visited friends 
here last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Worth Gafford 
visited relatives in San Angelo 
last Sunday.

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs A L. Smith during the Eas­
ter holidays were Mr. and Mrs. 
Lyndal Smith of Dallas. Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Parker of Waco 
and Wayne Smith of McMurry 
College in Abilene.

Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Partridge 
visited relatives in Fort Worth 
over the week end.

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Borden 
and son of Wichita Falls were 
visitors with their parents. Mr. 
and Mrs Press Phillips and Mr. 
and Mrs. J. C. Borden, over the 
week end.

Miss Lou Campsey of llardin- 
Simmons University, Abilene, 
was a holiday guest with her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. S. B. Camp 
scy.

James Smith, who is attending 
Texas Tech In Lubbock, visited 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. B. E. 
Smith, over the Easter holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. Duune Russell of 
Vernon visited relatives a n d  
friends here during the week 
end.

Mrs. Nora Broach and John 
Broach of Goree visitt*d rela­
tives In Lubbock last Sunday and 

i Monday. Mrs. John Broach and

Mrs. T. II. Armstrong and
Miss Peggy Armstrong were 
Wichita Falls visitor last Sat­
urday.

Miss Marguerite Hammett, 
who is attending Hardin-Shit- 
mons University In Abilene, vis­
ited her parents. Mr. and Mrs. % 
G. B. Hammett, over the Easter 
holidays.

Guests in the home of Mrs. U. 
S. Rogers for the Easter holi­
days were Mr. and Mrs. R. L. 
Burton of Haskell. Mrs. Alice 
Wray of Kermit, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dors«* Rogers and Bill of Goree. 
Mrs. E. L. Jones of Canrhtll. 
Ar., Mr. and Mrs. Bailey Toli­
ver of Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs 
Troy Warren of Wink.

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. L. E. Hunter of G one on 
Easter Sunday were Mr. and

★  COMPLETE
AIR CONDITIONER SERVICE

We sell, install and service air condi­
tioners.

We can give you a complete job, in­
cluding duct work and necessary wiring. 
Let us figure with you on any type of air 
conditioner installation,

James W. Carden
Dealer for Buth Berry Water Pumps 

— Phone 1431—

Week end guest' in the home j 
of Mr. ind Mrs. R M Almanrod" 
were Mr. and Mrs L. S. Par 
trldge and Mrs. M A Horton of | 
Bowie.

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Searcy last Sunday were Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Barnes and Sue 
and Mrs. Ella Clowdis of Abi- I 
lene, Mrs. Lovey Barnes of Has j 
kell, Margaret and Debbie Clow- 
dls of Munday. Cindy Haskin of [ 
Gore«* and Mrs Westerman of 
Seymour.

j  IN...'

Th an k You
Yes. we say “ thank you” for your pa­

tience with us during our remodeling 
process. We know th e  work slowed us 
down and prevented us from giving you 
the type of service we wanted to give, 
but you have been very considerate dur­
ing these weeks.

All of our new equipment lias been in­
stalled and is now in operation. We are 
able to give you quicker and a more com­
plete service than ever before.

We plan to hold open house in the near 
future, at which time we want you all to 
see our remodeled shop, but come in at 
your convenience and look it over.

W e are now equipped to dry size or wet 
size all dresses and blouses that require 
it. This gives new life, a new look a n d  
makes them last longer.

Now is the time to have your winter 
clothes “de-mothed” and stored away 
for the summer. Take advantage of our 
service and free storage. We still have 
plenty of storage space.

King’s Cleaners
Joe Bailey King Phone 4Ô31

. . . .  is a happy story 
for homemakers! . . . .  These miracle- 
fabric shirts wash in a breeze . . . .  
dry in a wink . . . . ncinl no ironing! 
Get some today!

Sport Shirts
Short-sleeved style in a 
cool, airy weave, and col­
ors.
2.9k and 3.98 values

Nylon Plisse
Short sleevc*d styles In 
popular weave. Choice 
of colors.
Values 2.99

1.99

Nylon

Sport Shirts
Rinse out, dry, and wear! 
A real boon to men who
(ravel! Buy now!

CoU'6
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without th*> help of government 
cash.

But I contend man Is as smart 
as most Insects, and I would like 
to see this new program of de­
fense Invention started. What the 
defense against a hydrogen 
bomb will lie, I have no idea. As 
I understand it. it'll dig a hole 
IfiO f<*et deep and spread heat for 
miles around, so bomb shelters 
are out. Tryin to intercept a 
plane carryin one of them bombs 
is hazardous and sooner or later 
one of em Is bound to get 
through.

What we really need Is some­
thing along the line of radar 
rays of some sort which can be 
sent out all over the world from 
one s|H>t and explode the bomb 
ahead of time. Probably would 
not anything slow a man down 
from makin a bomb as the 
knowledge somebody else was 
likely to make it go off before 
he was ready to drop it. Very 
few people would be interested 
in carrying a time bomb around 
in their coat pocket if somebody 
else was in charge of the clock.

If you think this idea will 
work, go ahead and work out 
the mechanical details while I 
move on to other thinkin ami we 
will split the $75,000. I advise 
speed, though. We may not have

Knox Prairie Philosopher Comes 
Out With Unworkable Defense Idea 
Against The Awful Hydrogen Bomb

Editor's note: The Knox Prair­
ie Philosopher on his Johnson 
grass farm on Miller ( ’reek 
won’t get anywhere with his 
idea this week, but that has 
never stopped him.
Dear editar:

I was out here the other after­
noon watchin my rain gauge 
while we were getting a little 
shower, three are few pleasures 
in life greater thfin the fun of 
watchin rain fall after a long 
drouth, even a shower, and 1 
found a water-soaked newsiwper 
caught In a clump of weeds and 
took it to the house and dried it 
out. some newspapers are dull 
enough when dry but when wet 
they’re about like water-logged 
lightbread.

The only article in the paper 
that attracted my attention was 
one about a United States Sena­
tor who was urgin the govern­
ment to put up cash awards for 
inventions for defense, to head 
o ff the inventions for attack.

Accordin to this Senator, the 
government ought to put up 
some real money to get the in­
ventors to turn their minds tow­
ard defense, and he wants to of 
fer as much as $73,000 per Idea 
if It’ll work.

I think this fellow is on the 
right track, although I don’t 
know what the results will be. 
There are some people who say 
man isn’t as smart say as in­
sects. Take flies. When man 
brought out DDT a few years 
ago. it must have been as alarm­
ing and nerve-wracking to flies 
as the hydrogen bomb Is to man, 
but what happened? The flies 
went to work and in less than 
two years h a d  maneuvered 
around to where they had devel­
oped immunity to DDT. even

How to Use a Wrench
'P U B  N a tion a l Safety Council 
* offer* the following instruction* 

for the safe and correct use of 
wrenches:

1. Use wrenches that are the 
right type and sise for the 
job. Never use a piece of pipe 
on the handle to get more 
leverage.

WRENCHES

WRONG ~7 ^  BIGHT /

5.

Use only wren ouving 
jaws in good condition; keep 
pipe wrench jaws sharp and 
clean.
Never use 
the wrong sine 
the nut.
Do not use a wrench a* a i 
hammer. Such use weaken* I 
it.
Always place the wrench on 
the nut so that the pull on 
tike handle tends to force the , 
jaws further onto the nut. 
Pulling on a wrench is safer 
than pushing. If you must 
push, keep your knuckles in 
the clear.
Avoid falls; see that your 
footing is good before you 
pull.

Weekly Health 
L E T T E R

IsNiied by Dr. Geo. W. fox . 
M. I)., Slate Health Officer 

of Texas

This is the time of year that 
must towns in Texas conduct 
their annual clean up c ampaigns. 
Dr. Goo. W. Cox. State Health 
Officer, suggests that whenever 
such activities are planned to 
keep in mind the various meas­
ures necessary to get rid of rats.

Rats are noted carriers of dis 
! ease. Some of the diseases trans 
I mltted by rats or their hosts are 

bubonic plague, typhus fever, 
dysentery, food infection, trlchin 

I osis, infectious jaundice, and 
Kocky mountain fe ver. Rats are 
scavengers that live on filth as 
well as edible foods. They thrive 

I in insanitary places such as gar- 
1 hage dumps, trash plies and sew­
ers.

If you don’t see rats it doesn’t 
| necessarily mean that they are 
not near you. Rats are not often

bring to humans and because of 
their enormous destruction of 
food, crops and merchandise, the
importance o f getting rid of 
rats is apparent. In addition, 
homes and communities are more 
enjoyable if they are clean and 
free of animals and inser ts that 
cause disease

L O C A L S

Easter holidays here witn his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Rat­
liff.

days.

a -him 0. make .
wrench fit sw’n but their destruction is evi- 

’ dent wherever they have- Ix-en. 
Sometimes they t an tic traced by 
their dirty runways. In store 
houses, sacks and boxes of 
grain and food with holes gnaw­
ed in them and the» contents 

i spilled are evidence of rat dc- 
j struction. Occasionally r a t s  
start fires by gnawing and short- 

I circuiting electric wires or by 
chewing on matches 

j Ttie rat lives in filth. Almost 
I any pile of trash, small piles of 
lumber, cluttered barns, garages, 

¡yards or homes afford harborage 
for him. Rat proofing is effec-

Sonny Lang, student at Mid 
western University in Wichita 
Falls vsiited his mother. Mrs W. 
W. laing, during the* holidays.

f ’harles Ratliff, who is attend 
ing S. M U, in Dallas spent the

COMPUTE PLANT 

FOOD MAKES 

GARDENING

SUCCESS EAST!

Week end guests in the home i 
of Mr. and Mrs. W O. Hardy j 
were Mr. and Mrs. Travis Hardy \ 
and children of Abilene. Mr. and 
Mrs Bob Beauchamp of Abilene 
and Mrs. Etta Lou Cox of Lub j 
bock.

Scotty and Danny Ponder, both | 
students in Texas Tech in Lub ! 
bock were visitors here witn I 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs E. R | 
Ponder, during Hie Easter holi-

VOTK for—

Lloyd Waldrip
—FOR—

Commissioner
PRECINCT NO. 1 

KNOX COUNTY

j

Ü

week end.

. .  . . .  , ,  . „  ... live and permanent. However.
. . . . .  . . .. even rat proofed buildings may

of Lubbock were guests in the t e s t e d  „  , t,s an- allow
A. L. Smith home during the ^  throuf;h op4>|, or wln.

dows. It has been calculates! that 
a pair of rats having plenty of 

| food and shelter could is- respon- 
! Bible for the production of 1400 
|rats in a single year

Because of the clanger rats

Planta thrive when they get 
the proper nourishment they 
require from the soil. The 

iy way t o b e s u r e  yov 
aJ

ly fed is to feed everything 
you grow with Vigoro, com­
plete plant food.

Vigoro ia clean, odorless, 
sanitary, and easy to usa 
It’s economical, you only 
need 4 pounds o f Vigoro per 
100 sq. ft. We have the sup­

plies you need.

much time.
Yours faithfully, 

J. A. a r a o o u c r  
o r  t w i n

Give GOD 
a Chance

LUk N O W !
ATTEND CHURCH EVERY SUNDAY

(Spreaders Available)

ATKEISON’S 
Food Store

i n  m t t  n> a u  Htw

T i n s t o n *

DEEP TREAD
GROUND GRIP

T R A C T O R  T I R E

• ★ M o r e  draw bar«
pull with d«*p«r 
»oil penetration

★  Longer tire l|ff  
with more tread 
rubber # • * • 4

★  More to v i n a i  
wi t h new 1 ^ /  
price* , . • *s r

Stodghill
HOME and AUTO SUPPLY

“Your Firestone Dealer”

lADY ite m  (O lia *
?! imK 14* t-so l,«~) ««( Pik« . . »71»
NOW ONI Y * 5 7 1 ?

NOtHN
19 Je*eh Eipm *on brece 
let R tf  Ptk# WOO
NOW 0NIY * 5 2 ? ?

1/
SABIA

omed crystal 
R tf Pnce 142 90

NOW ONIV * 3 4 ? ?
P.KM ma M

tots item renna
n  Noth 14* | *d MHO>n P.K«.. »/no 
NOW 0N4Y * 5 7 1 ?

19 JeweH (ipMUM beefl
Ref Price . 16/90

NOW ONI Y * 5 4 ? ?

CABISAAB
UKKXWASTtt

IT lewett Cerxed cmlal 
Ref Pnce 94/ 90

NOW ONIY * 3 8 ? ?

LIMITED TIME 
ONLY . . . FIRST 
TIME IN ELGIN’S 

90-YEAR  
HISTORY. . .

EVERY ELGIN
IN C LUD ED  IN 
THIS SWEEPING 

OFFER
ALL 19S4 MODELS!

Take Your Choice 
AND THEN 

Take Your 20% 
SAVING FROM 

ORIGINAL 
FACTORY PRICE 

TICKETS . . .

20% OFF and 
Credit, T o o  i

PAY AS LITTLE AS
*1 A WEEK!

ELGIN
SPRING TIME 

SAVINGS
OAm good omly oottl Amo I

Which

#

Tsso)
UNIFLOMotor oil

thes If your oar in lean -than 4000m/olol
Begirt to u ie  Esso Uniflo right aw ay  and  
continue to use i t s o  Uniflo throughout tha 
l it* at your tor.
This is a new type oil for high compression 
engines. Uniflo minimizes the deposits that 
arc a principal cause of knocking and pre- 
igmtion ping Highest viscosity index prevents 
engine “ drag,” thus saves gasoline. HD, anti­
acid, detergent. You get smoother, quieter 
engine performance . . . lower maintenance 
costs . . improved gasoline mileage. A must 
for every new * car.

should

[Esso)
EXTRAMotor oil

Richmond
Jewelry HUMBLE

MUMIll O il « BIMNINO COMPANY

Hyour oar is over4000mi. old *
Humble recommends Fs io Cxtro; it will give  
you outstanding performance.
Economical to buy, Esso Extra Motor Oil 
gives you more for your money than any 
other oil in the same price range. HD, anti­
acid, detergent I engthens engine life, gives 
you better lubrication, a better oil seal, a 
cleaner engine. Premium quality . . . out­
standing performance.

*Many Texans began to use Esso Uniflo in new l<)53 automobiles.
If you arc one of these. Humble recommends that you cortinue to 
use Esso Uniflo, no matter how many miles you have on your car.
To make a new car’s engine run better and last longer, you should 
hegm to use Esso Uniflo when the car is less than 4,(XX) miles old 
and continue to use Esso Uniflo throughout the life of the car.

;sso Uniflo • Esso Extra
M O T O R  O I L S
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Hose

Parade
Buy Your Hose at Cobb’s and SAVE!
•  NYLON DELUXE HOSIERY 

CO (auge. 15 denier, first qual 
HT. only—

Ctk- pr.

• BERKSHIRE STOCKINGS 
Any hose for any occasion. 

$1.35, $1.65. $1.95

• (LACSSNER HOSE 
Beautiful spring and summer 

colors. Any shade you need 
S1..H5, SLAV $1.95

TEMPLE MILADY'S
luxurious first quality 

Dupont nylon in 51 
and 15 denier 

T9e Pair

• Dl'PONT NYLON
Duelene stockings of dis­

tinction. First quality, 51 
gauge, 15 denier.
First Pair only . .  $1.15
**«-< <«nd Pair -Kilv .85
Third l*air FREE

LOCALS Gilliland Club 
Meets April 7th

Mr. and Mrs. John Spann, Mr. 
and Mrs. Oscar Spann, Mr. and
Mrs. George Spann and Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnny Spann of Abilene 
and Mr. and Mrs. Chester Sars- 
held of Irving attended the wed­
ding of Joe Spann and Miss Na- 
oma Mooring in Clarendon iasl 
Friday. They returned home on 
Saturday and the Spanns of Abi­
lene and the Sarsfields visited In 
the J. C. Spann home over Sun­
day.

Visitors in the Bruce Burnett 
home for the Easter holidays 
were her sisters. Mr. and Mrs.
T. StaU and family of Midland. 
Mrs. W. M. Huskinson of Wichi­
ta Falls and Mrs. E. M Roberts 
and daughter of Amarillo.

Guests in the home of Mrs G. 
P. Burns for the Easter holidays

Too Late to Classify
FOR SALE 1 bedroom suite, 

practically new box springs 
and mattress, 1 baby bed, 1 
diningroom suite consisting of 
table, buffet and 6 chairs. Mrs. 
J B. Graham, phone 3601. ltc

The Gilliland Home Demon­
stration Club ladies assembled 
in the club room on Wednesday, 
April 7. with Mrs Elton Carroll 
in charge of the business meet­
ing Mrs. J. T Cook called the 
roll, and each member answered 
by "safety In the home."

The meeting was turned over 
to the leader, Mrs Homer Martin 
and Miss Damie Groves, who di­
rected the final phase of the 
work simplification program 
which was on Ironing a shirt and 

j hanging out the wash.
The 4-H Club girls displayed 

the cakes, cookies and breads to 
lie Judged, and each girl won a 
ribbon.

Refreshments were served to 
23 members and the agent by 
Mrs. George Solomon, hostess.

, were Mr. and Mrs. Jim Price. 
Ronnie and Patti. Mr. and Mrs. 
Vernon Spaeth and Michael, Mrs. 
Cecil Cheek and Donovan, and 

'Mr. and Mrs. T. A. Walker, all 
of Fort Worth.

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Leverett 
and children visited relatives in 
Abilene during the holidays.

PRICE Our Sno Breeze Wash­
ed Air Coolers before you buy. 
Rfg. Air Conditioners. Liberal 
trade-in on old equipment. 
Wm. Cameron & Co. 39-tfc

Mr. and Mrs. Coy Jennings 
and daughter attended a family 
reunion in Canadian during the

.week end.

FOR SALE—30 gallon glass lin­
ed hot water heater, with 10- 
year guarantee. Call 5481, Mun- 
day 39-tfc

WANTED—Woman to stay with 
semi invalid for next three or 
four weeks Contact Mrs. Allle 
Ware at Knox Countv lb >! :> 
aL ltp

FOR RENT Square bungalow 
house. 3 rooms and bath. R. L. 
Gaines. ltc

FOR SALE Anemia llegari 
seed. First year. *3.00 per U»> 
J. D. Farber. 7 miles north of 
Munday on Farm Road 267.

39-3tp
FOR SALE Red Top cane seed. 

Mrs. Angela Redder at Rhine 
land. 39-2tc

Mr. and Mrs. O. H. Spann. Jr., 
and daughter of Sweetwater 
spent the week end with their 
parents. Mr. and Mrs Jack 
Clowdls and Mr. and Mrs. Oscar 
Spann.

Mr. and Mrs. Duane Alexander 
of Vernon were week end guests 
in the home of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. R. L. Alexander.

Jerry Lemley visited h 1 s | 
aunt and uncle, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Lemley, in Wichita Falls 
last Monday and Tuesday.

u.*

Holiday visitors in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. H. D. Henson 
were Mr. and Mrs. Dub Grisham 
and children and Mrs. Billy Joe 
Pruitt and son of Wichita Falls 
and Glen D. Henson, who Is at­
tending Texas Tech In Lubbock.

G O O D Y E A R
TIRE

Save now! — Ret the new Pathfinder at 
this rock bottom price. There's plenty of 
strength ami wear in its 100% rayon cord 
body. Its famous Goodyear diamond 
non-skid tread will give you excellent 
traction on all roads. Stop In now — tee 
the new Pathfinder by Goodyear.

FOR O N LY

1

ONLY $1JS e

NEED Awnings or D o o r  F. E. Jetton and Myrtle were
Hoods? In stock, colorful met- in Seymour last Monday to visit 
al awnings green, blue and Lynell Jetton at the hospital, 
red. 36 months to pay. nothing Mr and Mrs. C. C. Brown 
down. A n y  sire available, spent the holidays on their farm 
Wm. Cameron A Co. 39-tfc in Shamrock.

» Reeves Motor Co.
Dial 5631 Munday, Texas

A U X IN  GOIJ>EN BRAND

OLEO lb. 19c
WILSON —All Vegetable S I B TIN

BAKE-KITE 69c
• <|l K K. EASY MEAL! 

WILSON ( HOPPED

BEEF can 37c
f -

K
■ [ as 'I s' ?

-

jr

A (JUCK SNA« K N XBW O

GRAHAM CRACKERS
IB  BOX

29c
SMOOTH. UNIFORM RAMA IB. J \K

PEANUT BUTTER 33c
GOOD TO EAT—GOOD FOR YOU vrOKEI.Y

SPINACH No. 2 can 13c
NTOKKI.Y RED TART l-OK PIES

CHERRIES tall can 23c
• A <yn< K MEAI

CUT SPAGHETTI 
CUT MACARONI 
SHELL MACARONI

r—WITH « HEESE

lb . p k g . _  1 § Q
FOLG ER *S

COFFEE
«limit)

lb 99c
I neon dit io nail y 

Guaranteed

n a  stk nom
i P R I N K l I R

M  Cw W téummé »•••**• «“ "J00 t» apr.nJo« e*#y eoo

20 ft 2.39
30ft. ... .. 3.09
40 ft 3.69
50 ft,... 4.09

PI 1 MP 41 K Y—TENDER . . . .  ARMOUR ALL MEAT

FRANKFURTERS II) 47c
HIGHLY NCTKITOU8—REALLY DELI«TOCs BEEF

CHUCK ROAST II 37c
BATTERY FED—FRESH DRESSED—TENDER and YOUNG

Fryers lb 45c
I BAN, APPETIZING—WILSON CRISP KITE

BACON II 69c
NO NEED TO FIX—TRY THEM. ASSORTED (OLD CUT

LUNCH MEAT II 49c
lAJNAKl SKKI) • Mixed and 1C«-, nmmended by Haty AvI

PARAKEET SEED ">• «*«. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . "21c
A T K E IS O N ’S

“Where Most Folks Trade”

FREE
DAISY

SALT and PEPPER 
SHAKERS

OF IXTRA
COSTI

INSIDE
SPECIAL PKCS. 'T ,

ßiXt̂ CiockiA
PIE
CRUST
M IX

PKCS.

WELCH’S FROZEN—READY TO L’SE

GRAPE JUICE can 21c
CAPE ANN FROZEN FILLET

CATFISH 1lb. 35c
COLORADO MrCLl'KE or RUSSET

SPUDS . 10 lbs. 35c
FRESH. GREEN, < RISP STALKS

CELERY 1lb. 10c
UHESII PACKED CELLO

CARROTS |)kg.9c
★  Fresh Texas Greens

— Full of Vitamins and Mineral»

TURNIP GREENS 
(OLLARL)S bunch 
MUSTARD

FROM CALIFORNIA’S FINEST FRLTT—-8CNKIMT

LEMONS lb. 12 Vic
Spring Cleaning Needs

HARD GLOSS

GLO-COAT pt. 49c
• TAKES THE WORK OCT OF BATHROOM 

CLEANING. DLH POSABLE.

JOHNNY MOP ea.1.09

K

mmm


