
KNOX COUNTY NEWS
R 16 KNOX C ITY , KNOX COUNTY, TEXAS 79529 THURSDAY, JANUARY 29, 1976 Single Copy Price 15c, including Tex

ree Time 
day Night

A new feature, a S25 jack­
pot, introduced at laat 
month's Jamboree, w ill go to 
some lucky person Also dur­
ing the show, door prizes will 
be awarded as compliments of 
several Knox City merchants.

A concession stand will also 
be sponsored by the KC 
Jamboree Association and 
everyone is invited to visit the 
concession stand during the 
program.

]| The KC Jamboree Band 
will play and sing such favo- 

of rites as "Steel Guitar Rag,”  
as “ Bouquet of Roses," "Rag- 
f  time Annie,”  “ Waltz You 

Saved For M e ," "W hy Me. 
Lord?", "Over the Waves,”  
“ Four W alls," “ Rubber 
Dolly," "Ghost Riders in the 
Sky," “ Blue Eyes Crying in 
the Rain." " I 'm  So Lonesome 
I Could C ry ." "Have I Told 
You Lately." "Keep on Sing 
ing ," "Mama Don't 'Low No 
Music Played in Here," and 
“ What a Day That W ill Be."

Association officials have 
been well-pleased with the 
crowds and will continue to 
charge admission prices of $1 
and SO cents with proceeds 
going toward community 
recreation.

Join your neighbors, as 
well as vour friends from 
neighboring towns, and be on 
hand Saturday night for a toe- 
tappin' good time!
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On Saturday, April 3

Joint Election Set By 
City, School, Hospital

BUSILY PREPARING FOR TH E PAN C AKE SUPPER to t»  hold Friday n ight are 
these Brownie scouts who have been selling tickets and d isp lay ing posters in 
downtown business windows F irst row, from  le ft, are D 'Layna Douglas, v is ito r 
Pat M cCrary, C hrist! Clayton, Shelly Rumley, Jo Hearn, and Leah Boone 
Second row, from  le ft, Paula Chambers. Becky Underwood, M indy M owrey, 
Tammy Rogers, Lynn McCrary, Melissa Pierce, and Stephana Rhodes Back row 
are leaders Carolyn McCrary and Sandra Chamber*.

Brownies To Sponsor Supper
The Knox City Brownie 

Troops will he sponsoring a 
Pancake Supper Friday night. 
January 30, in the school 
cafeteria.

Serving hours will be from 
4:30 p.m. until 6:30 pm  

All tickets are il.2 >  and 
may be purchased from any

Brownie or at the dour.
Brownies who made 

posters for the supper and 
brought them downtown for 
display included Leah Boone. 
Paula Chambers, Christi 
Clayton. D'Layna Douglas. 
Lynn McCrary. Mindy Mow 
rcy, Melissa Pierce. Slcphane
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Smith In Process Of Mailing 
Voter Registration Certificates

Rhodes, Txmmy Rogers. 
Shelly Kumlcv. Becky Under­
wood. Jo Hearn, Eloisa 
Agra/. Rhonda Averitt. Glen­
da and Linda Hunter. Barbie 
McGaughey. Jennie Vasque/. 
and Tammy Workman

Troop leaders are Sandra 
Chambers and Carolyn 
McCrary.

Everyone is encouraged to 
attend ibis fund raising sup 
per and support our local 
Brownies.

Knox County Tax Assessor- 
Collector John A. Smith 
announced this week that his 
office is in the process of 
mailing out voter registration

certificates to all known quali­
fied voters in Knox County.

Smith explained that i f  the 
informalion on a voter's certi­
ficate is correct, then he

Former Resident’s 
Article Published

Dr. Joe L. Cash, who is in 
his fourth year as associate 
professor of English at 
McNeese University in Lake 
Charles, Louisiana, has an 
article appearing in the cur­
rent issue of "Louisiana 
English Journal," the official 
publication of the Louisiana 
Council o f Teachers of 
English.

Dr. C.M. Byrne, head of 
the Department of Languages 
at McNeese. adds that "the

City Clean-Up 
Plans Begun

The Knox City Study Club 
and the Knox City Garden 
Club are joining forces in 
promoting a clean-up cam 
paign for the entire town 
during the last week in Febru 
ary

Help has been promised 
from Mrs. Ernie Wilson. Gar­
den Club president; Mrs. J.C. 
McGee. Study Club presi­
dent; Mayor R Kenneth 
Crownover, City Secretary 
Faye Railtback. Scout mast rr 
Joe Clonts. Lions President 
Pete Edition. Supt. of Schools 
W.R, Baker. Chamber 
Secretary-Manager Doris 
Crownover. Fire Chief Drew 
Holcomb, and mtniiters of all 
Knox ' City churches, accord­
ing to Mrs C.C. Hoge, 
spokesman

She did say that the city 
truck hat been offered to haul 
off all trash and that the 
organizations are hopeful that 
residents will begin now to 
plan an all-out clean-up of the 
town.

Mrs Hoge urged that resi­
dents take an interest in the 
campaign and more details 
will appear in future wattes of 
the News

DR. JOE L. CASH

article is an expansion of a 
paper which Dr. Cash read al 
the last meeting of the Col­
lege English Association of 
America."

Entitled "A  Defense for 
Silas Marner and a New 
Approach for Teaching the 
Novel." Dr. Cash's thesis is 
that English teachers may 
spend too much time compar 
ing a work like "Silas Mar 
ner" to our own century or 
making it immediately rele­
vant instead of attempting to 
find more serious and endur 
ing literarv themes which do 
exist in it.

“ An archetypal approach to 
the novel allows the simulta­
neous teaching of several 
facets of literary awareness 
by means of a comparison of 
'Silas Marner' with Oedipus 
R ex.'" Dr Cash said

Dr. Cash, win of Mr and 
Mrs. thn * l  ath, is married to 
the former Lydia Cone, who 
teaches sixth grade in the 
public schools there. They axe 
the parents of two children. 
Josef, who is almost tea, and 
Sarah, two.

should sign it in the place 
designated for signature of 
voter and keep it.

However, he said, if any of 
the information is incorrect, 
the voter should return it with 
the corrections to be made to 
the tax Assessor-Collector's 
office in the Courthouse in 
Benjamin.

Lions Okay 
Sale Plans

At the Wednesday noon 
meeting. Lkin President Pete 
Elhsion announced that the 
date of May 6 has been 
approved for the Mop and 
Broom Sale benefiting the 
Lighthouse for the Blind

Guests attending were 
Weldon Smilh, a pastor from 
Munday. Bob T. Gallagher, 
regional director. West Cen 
tral Council o f Government; 
Brad Helbert. assivtant dircc 
tor. and Mrs. Sue Johnson, 
director of youth services for 
the C O G

Gallagher was the speaker 
and explained many of the 
workings of their service or­
ganization that coven 19 
counties, maintaining an of­
fice in Abile.ic. He stated that 
his office assists cities and 
counties in formulating a plan 
for improvements for their 
area or in overcoming a 
problem in housing and urban 
development. In this service, 
thev help avoid duplicatc 
government programs.

Another function is that the 
C O G. sponsors and provides 
free training for peace o ffi­
cers who desire to work 
toward certification

Knox City uses a portion of 
the service this agent.v af 
fords in employing cenain 
hoys and girls for work in the 
school system and over the 
community

First Sunday Singing 
Set At Foursquart

The First Sumlav Singing 
will hr held at the Foursquare 
Gospel Oiurch, Sundav 
February I. from 2 until 4 
pm .

Held monthly, the First 
Sundav Singing is a lime to 
enjoy good gospel singing and
felkiwship

Band Boosters To 
Meet Monday Night

The Knox City Band 
Boosters w ill have their regu 
lai meeting. Monday, Fc 
bruarv 2. at 7:30 p m. in the 
Band Hall.

The program for the even­
ing will be presented by the 
fifth grade band, composed of 
17 members. The group will 
perform a “ Mini Concert" 
playing several numbers to­
gether and then will provide 
five short ensembles

According to a spokesman, 
all band boosters, parents, 
and guests are invited to 
attend this program

The City of Knox City, the 
Knox City Independent 
School District, and the Knox 
County Hospital District will 
again hold their respective 
•lections together this year 
and have set the joint election 
for Saturday. April 3. in the 
Community Center Polls will 
be open from 7 00 a.m until 
7:00 p.m.

In the city election, the 
terms of councilmen L.V 
Worley. Celso Gonzales, and 
Charles Auburg will expire 
At this time, none of the 
incumbents have indicated 
whether or not they will seek 

re-elect ion.
Holdover council members 

arc Mayor R Kenneth
Crownover and councilmen 
A P Denton and Vernon 
Bridges.

City Secretary Faye Rails- 
back said that any eligible 
person who desired to file 
may do so at the City Hall To 
be eligible, a person must 
have resided in the State of 
Texas the past 12 months and 
a resident of the city the past 
six months.

School board members 
whose terms are expiring arc 
Jerry Benson and Henry Jean 
Jones

According to Mrs Mary 
Beth Smith, business mans 
ger of Knox City School s. no 
one has filed as yet.

Holdover members with 
one sear remaining are Allen 
McGaughey and John L. 
Gnndstaff Jr

John Crownover. Dr. R G. 
Howell, and Doug Meinzcr

will serve another two years 
Forms may be picked up ai 

the school from Mrs Smith 
for the school election, but 
all completed applications 
must be filed with Knot 
County Judge Sam E. Clonts 
at Benjamin to be eligible 

In the hospital election, the 
terms of Richie Smith of 
Munday and Vernal Zeissel of 
Rhineland will expire.

Henry Jean Jones of Knox 
City is the holdover member.

Accxirding to hospital ad 
mmistrator. Glen Kumlcv. no 
one has filed.

Filing deadline for the hos­
pital election is 2s days prior 
to the election date

Anyone w ishing to file as a 
candidate must be IH years of 
age or older, must be a 
registered, qualified voter of

the district, own land subject 
to taxation by the district, and 
submit a petition to the 
secretary of the board. Richie 
Smith, in Munday The pen 
lion must contain the names 
of mil less than 2> qualified 
voters residing within the 
boundary of the hospital dis 
trict.

Petitions lor the positions 
may be picked up al the Knox 
County Hospital

Deadline for filing in the 
city and school elections is 
March 3.

Absentee voting by per 
sonal appearance will begin 
March IS and continue 
through March 30 Mrs 
Kailsback will serve as absen 
Ice voting clerk for the city 
and Mrs. Smith will serve in 
this capacity for the school

Knox City To Host 
Junior High Tourney

The Knox City Junior High 
Basketball tournament has 
been scheduled January 29 
and 31 and will gel underway 
this afternoon (Thursday I 
with Munday and Rochester 
girls beginning ihe action at 
4:30 Following their game, 
the boys of these two towns 
will play at >:4> p.m

The host team. Knox City, 
will meet Rule with the girls' 
game beginning at 7:00 p.m

Stanton Brown Chosen 
As BYRA President

A new slate of officers was 
elected al the meeting of the 
Brazos Valley Recreation As 
sociation held Monday night 
at City Hall

Outgoing president Don 
Ratlsback called the meeting

Girls Stay Undefeated
Coach Steve Mcllhaney's 

Houndettes remain unde 
fealed in the second round of 
District 7-A play after win 
ning ihe game Tuesday night 
against Aspermont, 49 43. at 
Aspermont

Taking lop scoring honors 
for the Houndettes was Mary 
km Burl with 20. followed by 
Jane Arledge with 14, Shcryll 
Guinn with nine, and Sarah 
McGaughey with four

Coming out on top a flrr the

AREA
OIL NEWS

Of interest to many area 
persons, especially those in 
Ihe Truscotl Gilliland area, is 
the discovery well that blew in 
January IS on the J R Brown 
place about four miles south 
west of Truscotl Cities Ser 
vice Oil Company set casing 
at 6.309 feel. The well is 
producing from the Congki 
mrraic formation and a two 
hour drillstrm  test on January 
14 showed a possible twenty 
four hour potential of 4S6 
barrels of oil with no water 
showing Bottom hole pees 
sure was 3100 pounds,

first quarter uf piav. 16-14, 
the Greyhounds gave the 
Hornets a run lor their 
money; however, ihey were 
defeated NO-73.

Jimmy Don Moore was 
high point with 20 for K( , 
Jimmy Lynn had 19. folkiwed 
by Charlie Five with 16

In last Friday night's has 
ketball actum, the Houndettes 
took a decisive 39 2S win over 
the Munday Mogulrttes.

Aiding KnosCitv in scoring 
effort were Jane Arledge, 
who was high point girl fur 
the night with 26. followed by 
Marvkm Bun with nine, and 
Sheryll Guinn with four.

Kerri Coffman led Mundav 
scorers with 16 points.

Mundav defeated the Knos 
City boys, 7| ,v*. with Charlie 
Flyc taking lop scoring honors 
for the night with 14 to lead 
the Hounds Jimmy Don 
Moore scored 12 folkiwed bs 
Ricky Bishop and Jimmy Lvnn 
with 10 each

K.Q Toliver pumped a 
whopping 30 points to lead 
Munday to victory

The Knos City trams will 
meet Haskell here tomorrow 
(FridayI night with game time 
at 6 .30 p.m

Did You Know
that Mrs C K Chamberlain, 
Box 24>, Nacogdoches, Trias 
7>9W subscribes to The Knos 
County News*

to order and presented the 
recommendations o( the no­
minal ing committee to the 
members

Stanton Brown of Benjamin 
was elected president of the 
BVRA Other officers elected 
to serve this year were J.C. 
Eaton, vice president. Iron  
Burkham, secretary treasur­
er; Johnny D Reid, rodeo 
chairman: Pearl Faton. con­
cession stand chairman, and 
Mary Ann Bonne reporter

Following the election, 
plans were discussed lor the 
junior rodeo held annually by 
the BVRA A rodeo commit­
tee was appointed to assist 
rodeo chairman Rnd. Named 
to the committee were John 
Gnndstaff Jr., Bobbv Tan- 
krrslev, Joe Boone, and 
Charles lanklord Also, in 
conjunction with the rodeo, 
plans were discussed for a 
parade and a rodeo dance. 
Herbert Bellingbausen was 
appointed parade chairman 
and Joe Boone was named 
dance chairman

The group discussed plans 
for the upcoming season's 
plavdavs and for other events, 
including jackpot barrel rac 
ing and calf roping, to be held 
this spring and summer in the 
association's arena A ache 
dule of plavdavs and other 
events will be announced at a 
later date.

A Fun Day Committee was 
also appointed and consists of 
Jo Ann (Riser. Mary Ann 
Boone, and Jerry Johnston of 
O'Brien This is a new com­
mittee. whose purpose is to 
plan social activities for the 
association members and 
pre ispect iv t me mbera

Before adjourning. Brown 
esprrssed appreciation to the 
outgoing officers on behalf of 
the association.

follow rd bv the boys' game al 
II l> p m.

Losers of the first round 
will plav for consolation ho­
nors on Saturday with the 
girls ' game scheduled to be 
gin at 4:30 The respective 
boss' contest will folkiw at 
5:46.

Championship round plav 
erv will see action al 7:U0p m 
on Saturday starting with the 
girls and then folkiwed by the 
boss al ft Is  p.m

Coaching the iiimior high 
teams this year are Stephen 
Mctlhaney girls and Jimmv 
Rogers, boss.

Ambulance 
Discussion 
Set Feb. 9

Representatives of (mid 
Cross Ambulance Service of 
Wichita Falls w ill meet with 
members of the Knox County 
Commissioners' Court and 
representatives from each 
community in the county, as 
well as representatives from 
the Knos County Hospital 
District on Mondav. February 
9 at 2 00 p m in Ihe Knox 
County Courthouse at Benja 
mm.

Officials are continuing in 
the effort to provide ambu 
lance service for the counts as 
both Smith Funeral Home of 
Knox City and Rochester and 
McCauley-Smith Funeral 
Home ol Mundav have an 
nounccd intentions to discon­
tinue their ambulance service 
on March I

A survey was made by (iold 
Cross offuials Iasi Friday in 
regard to the previous ser­
vices afforded the county and 
on February 9. Gold Cross 
will make a presentation of 
costs ami services if they 
assume the ambulance ser­
vice

It will ihen be up to the 
various taxing entities as to 
whether the exists and ser­
vices fall within their planned 
expenditures.

Weather
FURNISHED B3 PLANT 
MATERIALS (ENTER 

4 Mites VA »( Knox ( Its

dale •ow high rain
12! 27 63
1-22 26 6A
1-2.3 4b 7$
1 24 36 63 tr
l-2> 2b 47
5-26 2b 43
1 27 20 SS



If fi i

HUUT’'

X

3 I U U U U U U U U
m O U M I M Hospital 

Hews
Poirbcai

*  , " t »  V T t^  UHL~JNt
r-||i**uv! aiui k*rtwsilf- <*'**

4 *•

«u Mil a w

n m w  M W L U 3wa uwui r ^
»..■■■ O W  m  Lou  :w _

Mt «m  n

lA -1  'mrm  VHrto im
«tlF tYUB «mJ
«r?

tlfpBA

tlarf arri '■*
'UAHS sOlt n-mr-

b . — ___a

cjd. j m
cJft v

-VO L e d -  ■
l i f t  YUd&m
I t t f  a U

«-u» U J  l«
■ME nrf*t>£

i r ’ tr jfjn f . 'an■ V ad 3as«<

7 »  L a a

«U

tor » •

iiU W tt  If.***'
2u i< eOmrinss 
« : P Q U * t

Oh

s JS # «JEW lu w  l u e r

cur> « »wi > w r

A 3  *
•  J i

. W B O  i i t t w  <utt|r
■■n -■ ■ ■ ►  K f t  . i r i lc a  lim n

i s  jr.wmm \

«•> j .  U M r.n ii n<
-4FS Iw r-TTH i»

• uiutii UfiT»T3

:ir l.T ■ turn
M  n talus* an r  <  •
L fr t

jw n lf L iu  ' mm

Cmi uvmmo

W  l  *  m l •» ua— a m r mot 
t o y s  amt tu rn  smr w  1.1 v k m  Law W h r-i
la m  V im  «■ F r a  ? «  a  r t I V . i U  I *  M t F T t L
Bat J p t  « tt t «i «nar *« « r l« M . U H  H  prv»
V y w  ssisf mMI Cmt  V  U h  ( V  U h l  la w  jm *

toa mu* *U mmr t r y  aal im fem ar haaaia l  Vat
saaar t  jm iV a t M m a  am vm M k  _ jr—• Fa i y  u
•  m l t v  « m »su*» toa t a m i  V M  f  mmtaii

tin. ku(  »-tf to m  *tJM*VM i# ___________________________ ___

1 "  * M M t  •  » 9I I »  V im  t

W iw i  » >W<T >11 
m ar ( r  i u a  a id

k

M T A  'l iw !  >pp* f
A»i iijiifem. «rr i 

Vir-nas *i#

"M M 2 M U M

I a n
MMT* V

ii.r-M -M '+ ea

KC Colored 
News-Events

««jnr * u w i  * K j n
y r a n r  as‘Mar toiurtan 
Miv tv  a r  MAuiiji aaaa.

r t  c u t m  n i t
a a iU  mMMMi

w it w

«  * Cm

i t r ' w j v ;  a a w n
£?' W %' Wadi 
no# tmaas itrosv

Mn
& ,

jjo ia u o

*!I

• w i  v u r *  >.*~ .
* •  t - ’.a v  Mr a m  o i ' . v  
mr .imr * m  - r-tr m a m  
M t r a  M mm *am am t
**♦- u j r  *  a V twm t v  «
t i u r r  MritiU |*» m t
4«air ' . must- Wrm

MtsBt iaii

a  « m i  t « a i  
a u u t  w V ttM M  
■ U .1  U M  J M W T - .t

• m b m im  v .« .n  n o
1 ••• Ler «r v  >mr issttoni).

H » u  toA-KT H i W t)
itnaad. UH i  mm$ tu ^ ii 1
ft ftft

v v  ~

^\ft W i M l  tMNt
i i*<t .M nr jt
tmr* u« i  aat «*unr ** 

ft * r|r »a«ir uam
lv  sm . M  W NW UPr
Vrwmgrad VJft I2ftft

?2 2 » e r - C ! o n t c *'tO la d -  "ima pr r  1—i.

In s u r a n c e
rmm satr * m to  y a f i
am i«mtnt-ta '.J t  m  J C  
SsW  1 A ) a

(to NT:

•

V  V'.w m  » tft a  small
s m n  lasts r HSr trumsi u f i  
W arn a V a  ' i n  

TW  Wttmana r to r im ctoc
n it  ts-ior «»;!l stay r Vs toe
i*to.itor *mt —'*sra Vs tor 
i m

~ir omMs il OaO fa r rt
V  m m r it  V a rn a  C .s a la n
V  jn tn r irn  ultlttf V  
sir i f  v  t M  ;  a . t i m  
dm  jw v a i mm V K  Dtir 
* »  i.r-uniC rr la a n te  
t4a- i  ».n Jmb P*n *  iltr

V  urr.tr* h n r n r  P»*s 
“  A.) .isaaia its siostr a |aM
N l ~rf*r •v V - ia m m ri •«— 

wp»r «T s aaitawy «n a Kate.

Attention,
Babysitters

> m * *  m  am V s v f uxto
-rrtMams l i ' j r - m a  >• ft Vs hsVina
i-m rus im  suUvl Sir V rv t at Mum t o m f __________
mission sic lulsuvitri —ir am m  a JS tuition 11 as
» t»r uftun a rf K tfk n f

*W  F— P  hJTTT
s ra s v  Mist j e m  •  «■> 
in n r  lu s ty -  - arnwi  t v  JH  U i l -

• - or !
^  -'l  ’ K  t u i  sartuun ‘ram t m  Ar tn Vani. s a u t■"

i  -  .  -  . , uari fiss -mr»T- ».tor ••-•*. I  w i  irut
IB *  MBs ’eZ&  W W i H  t H i Catl • IV--S

- l i f t  I  ' U f l  *  fcuun ~*r* *w CmroCwvl QW ttmt
™  >  , -  I-. , ai F 1 ram  t H r '

V , a a 1 -  r .T  »  --------------------------------------------  ' ‘ *  • ^
cats i t . y s s  sam  f 4 t  V U l^ ta tc tra r Cam _______J

team* « r  • »  in s  i sml ,____ ___.  #- ^  U P t U  <M H B
c m  M CI <W C M

.1 m 1* • '  in B T
F v «  mrcrawf ran weist

• t  m  H r im rtbw v  
■ IM »  m VaisttM' 

rs M | sLstrr V L M tlimna 
a e M  Vtsn K a ra  -{ l

S C U  tT FAST
y r t *  S «? •  < « »

O o u d ^ d  A d

DAIRY
Special Friday 

CATFISHS

cou*r »r mteŝ eâ
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CHARLIE’ S 
UPHOLSTERY ■ * w  w

s ----- * » *  TU A I
v  -T-.f,1 v/. '-4W Jm nM BM M M HI^^u

I
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s u m s  m s :

HYBFC QFAJN SOFQHUtl

PRODUCES 
TOP YIELDS!
T X f MEO OMAM THAT 
r r A M o *  U P . . .
o is c a s c  h m t a m t , 
d r o u g h t  T i x u u m

CMU(8liC«NIT.K

DON BOWMAN 
Phone 1817)673-2706 

Weinert, Texas

i - I

Announcing
Mundoy

Mwoicol ond S««r9 ca Ci nc
Now Opt*

C k e to r i  S c fw O a tft

>  W S  Ham  
arc Thun 13(M  X p .m . 

Saturday • 9 till noon
Or OanJackaon 

*a d  andFh. 1 3(M » p  m.
•MClftT ONItT NU«S€

W V L  B€ AT THC C U *»C  
MON Tm *MJ FNl 

10 0 0 A M  TO 5 00 P M
b a t u w o a v w a m  t il l  n o o n

SAVE NOW FOR A RAINY
No en* t t «  t« tKmk of ro.ny doy», but thoy do foil in •very*"’ 

***** ** Nm# So, itort today to proviso you no  If with an 1

Y°u |utt might hovo onough u k  a littlft f°'
doyi too

CITIZENS S TA TE BAH
m e m * e r  f  d  i .c  - i n s u r e d  t o  MO,000 

Kno* City. T tu >



lappenings
Wednesday to attend a meet­
ing at ACC. The meeting was 
sponsored by the TEA of 
Austin and was about how to 
take care of the forms con­
cerning the new school b ill on 
the valuation of tases. (You 
know they change things so 
often you never know if you 
are doing right or not. That is 
the reason I like to attend the 
tas conferences or schools 
each year, to catch up with all 
that has been changed.)

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry
Johnston and family were in
Abilene Saturday for Kerrie 
to see the doctor.

M r*. Eva Covey attended a 
Weight Watchers meeting in 
Abilene Saturday. Like a tax 
collector she has to attend 
meetings ever so often to 
keep with the changes.

One year ago today.
January 27, I entered the
hospital at Wichita Falls, and 
as shook up as Dr. Howell and 
the doctor up there. Dr. Bebb, 
had me I did not know for sure 
I would be here today to write 
the news, but I made it. For 
this I am very thankful, we 
can never get through count­
ing our blessings if we only 
take the time to list them.

The following are the stu­
dents at O'Brien that made 
the honor roll the past six- 
weeks. These are students 
making 90 or above on all 
subjects, with the exception 
of P.E.

HONOR ROLL
Third Six Weeks

12th
Hewitt, Vicki

REG ISTERED  
LAND 

SURVEYOR
Lynn 0 . Jackson 
Phone 422-4968 

Box 242, Munday

IRRIGATION

BOW MAN 
[ 8 1 7 ]  6 7 3 - 2 7 0 6  

nert, Texas

Olney Savings 
Promotes 
Max Anderson

Announcement of the pro­
motion of Max Anderson to 
Vice President-Savings was 
made this week by D.D. 
McClatchy, President of O f 
ney Savings Association

Anderson has been em­
ployed in the Home Office 
since May 5, 1975. He came 
to Olney from First Federal 
Savings and Loan Association 
of Lubbock where he served 
as Assistant Vice President 
and Savings Officer. He has 
also been administrator and 
organizer of Keogh and Indi 
vidual Retirement Accounts

He is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs Jeff Anderson of Mon­
day, and is married to the 
former Toni Leflar. daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. LeeRoy 
Leflar. also of Munday. The 
Andersons have one daughter 
Buffi

New officers to the staff of 
Olney Savings Association 
were also announced this 
week by Mr. McClatchy.

Billy R. Herod. newly 
elected Executive Vice Presi­
dent of Olney Savings, is 
Managing Officer of Ranger 
Savings, a division of Olnev 
Savings, and is also a member 
of the Ranger Advisory 
Board.

Mrs. Reba Rawls was
elected Vice President of Ol­
ney Savings. She also serves 
as a member of the Ranger 
Savings Advisory Board.

Jerry D. Davis was elected 
Assistant Vice President of 
Olney Savings.

Mrs. Eva Mills was elected 
Assistant Secretary of Olney 
Savings.

McClatchy stated, “ We are 
very proud to have the addi­
tion of such fine people to our 
s ta ff ’ .

11th
Brothers, Craig 
Del Hierro, Debbie 
Stockton. Pam 
10th
Gutierrez, Peggy 
Watson. Martha 
9th
Adkisson. Brenda 
Godsey, Jonathan 
Holmes. Donna 
Johnston, Shane 
Walling. David 
8th
Adkisson. Nancy 
Godsey, Joseph 
Reid, Angela

Chess Club To 
Meet February 2

The Knox County Chess 
Club will meet Monday, Feb­
ruary 2, at 7:00 p.m. in the 
home of Ben Smith.

All members are urged to 
attend.

AT JAMBOREE
Among those from Knox 

City attending the Munday 
Folk Music Festival in Mun­
day Saturday night were Tom­
my Kent, Lynn Tankersley. 
Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hester 
and children. Mr. and Mrs. 
Alton Hester, Emmy Jones, 
Mr. and Mrs. Brownie Tac- 
kitt, Mr. and Mrs. Buddy 
Angle and Stacy. Mr. and 
Mrs. J.D. Hollis, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Rob Johnston of 
O'Brien

NOTICE
id City Taxes For 1975 
Become Delinquent 

AFTER
ANUARY 31, 1976 

Penalty And Interest By 
ying Your Tax Before 

The Above Date
ty of Knox City

County 4-H'ers Place 
In Abilene Stock Show

Tammy Carver, 14 year old 
daughter of Mr and Mrs. 
Fred Carver and a Benjamin 
4-H'er showed her Heavy­
weight Medium Wool Lamb 
to second place in the Abilene 
Regional Fat Slock Show 
January 18-21, according to 
County Extension Agent Her­
man H. Collier

Tammy's Suffolk lamb

Acree Rites 
Held Tuesday

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Nadine Acree were held Tues­
day at 2:00 p.m. in the First 
Baptist Church in Rochester 
with Rev. Neal Sheppard, 
interim pastor, officiating. 
Burial was in the Rochester 
Cemetery with Smith Funeral 
Home in charge of arrange­
ments.

Mrs. Acree, 84. of Roches­
ter died at 7:00 a.m. Monday 
in the Brazos Valley Care 
Home after a brief illness.

Born in Gladewater, Texas, 
the daughter of the late Sadie 
and Walter Watkins, she 
married Edward Eugene 
Acree on July b, 1918 in Ryan. 
Oklahoma. The couple moved 
to Rochester from Ryan in 
1929. They started the Acree 
Oil Company in 1942 Mrs. 
Acree was active in the busi­
ness until she broke her hip 
on December 6, 1975. An 
active member of the Baptist 
Church, she was a member of 
the Mary Martha Sunday 
School Class. Mr. Acree pre­
ceded his wife in death on 
June 21, 1974. in Knox City.

Survisors include one son. 
Edward Kcele of Rochester, 
two grandvins. and one 
granddaughter.

Pallbearers were George 
Mullino, Knott Ballard. Virgil 
Mitchell. George Hodges. 
Walter Speck, and Guy Mar­
shall

Eight Accidents 
Occur In County

The Texas Highway Patrol 
investigated eight accidents 
on rural highways in Knox 
County during the month of 
December, according to Ser 
grant J.W. Garner. Highway 
Patrol supervisor of this area

No one was killed, but two 
persons were injured as a 
result of these accidents.

The rural traffic accident 
summary for this county dur­
ing the first 12 months of 1975 
shows a total of 68 acctdtnts 
rrsluting in no deaths and 25 
persons injured.

The rural traffic accident 
summary for the 60 counties 
of the Lubbock Department of 
Public Safety Region for De­
cember. 1975. shows a total of 
534 accidents resulting in 22 
persons killed and 325 per­
sons unjured. as compared to 
December. 1974, with 5% 
accidents resulting in 11 per­
sons killed and 340 persons 
injured. This was 64 less 
accidents. 11 more killed, and 
15 less injured in 1975 at the 
same period of time.

The traffic deaths for the 
month of December. 1975. 
occurred in the following 
counties and included four in 
Parker, three in Hardeman, 
two in Lubbock, and one each 
in Bailey. Dickens. Hockley. 
Jack. Montague. Palo Pinto, 
Wise, Young. Gray, Ochil­
tree, Parmer. Potter, and 
Wheeler.

HOME FROM LAS VEGAS 
Mr and Mrs Allen Hester 

returned home last week from 
a vacation in Las Vega*. 
Nevada

showing in the real large 
Hampshire and Suffolk Class 
was beaten only by the 
Champion Medium Wool 
Lamb of the show by a very 
close decision as the judge 
had them ahead of the Cham­
pion at one time.

In steer showing, Mary 
Denise Zeissel. Rhineland 
4 H er won sixth place with 
her mediumweight Angus 
Julie Dawn Partridge. Mun 
day 4-H. came in 12th with 
her lightweight Angus steer 
and 15th with her medium 
weight Hereford steer. Me 
lissa Zeissel. Rhineland 4-H. 
showed her mediumweight 
crossbreed steer to the 13th 
place.

Farm- Randi
N a m

BY HEBMAN C O I I f

COL'NTY JUDGES 
COMMISSIONERS

Die 18th annual conference 
of the County Judges and 
Commissioners of Texas will 
deal with issues that are 
today's problems, such as 
ambulance service. solid 
waste disposal and law en­
forcement. The conference 
which w ill be held February 
3-5 at Texas AAM University 
will also feature discussions 
on national and state legisla­
tion. agricultural markets and 
policy, the state comptroller's 
office and the Jail Standards 
Commission, announces a 
county officials program spe­
cialist for the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service. 
PRUNING TREES

Improper pruning of trees 
can be just as bad or worse 
than not pruning them at all 
On the other hand, proper 
pruning can turn a tree or 
shrub into a beautiful plant 
specimen. Ten pointers to 
consider as far as the pruning 
operation is concerned are:

I Do not top trees, lopped 
trees often die because the 
topped branches cannot heal, 
thus letting ui decay tungi 
and bacteria Also, side bran­
ches below topped stubs are 
usually weaker and are sub­
ject to wind damage

2. Prune at the right sea­
son. Prune deciduous trees 
and shrubs, vines, ground 
covers and evergreens during 
the winter. However, an ex­
ception is that spring- 
flowering shrubs such as 
azaleas, forsythis. bridal 
wreath and gardenias should 
be pruned after flowering.

3. Use proper tools. Hand 
shears can handle twigs un­
der one-half inch in diameter, 
long handled lopping shears 
are needed for timber 
one-half to one inch in diame­
ter. Branches larger than one 
inch in diameter should be cut 
with a pruning saw.

4 Make all cuts flush with 
the trunk Stubs don’t heal 
properly and the decay and 
deterioralin spreads down the 
trunk of the tree until wind 
topples it.

5. Seal big cuts with prun­
ing paint Use pruning paint 
on cuts larger than one inch in 
diameter to ward o ff insects 
and diseases.

6 Repair damaged plants 
at once. Plants should be kept 
healthy year round: this
means pruning damaged 
twigs or branches.

7. Use common sense when 
pruning Watch for limbs that 
may fall over power lines or 
damage other properly

8. Always prune after 
transplanting Pruning is es 
penally important for balled 
and-burlapped plants; this 
compensates for roots lost 
during digging

9 Beware of the door to 
door pruner II vou can't

*  ANNOUNCING +
KNOX CITY JUNIOR CLASS

*  FUN NIGHT *  
CARNIVAL

Friday, February 13
i f  In the Old Gym 41

Caka W«lk-Bli»©o P fli*» -F o riu n «  Tailor

*  FUNIII *

January 29,

Paul Siecke 
Burled Here

Commital services for Paul 
C. Siecke of Bryan were held 
Monday at 10:00 a.m. in the 
Knox City Cemetery with the 
Rev Derrell Marion, pastor of 
the First Christian Church of 
Knox City, officiating Smith 
Funeral Home was in charge 
of arrangements.

Funeral services for Mr. 
Siecke were held Sunday at 
2:00 p m. in the First
Christian Church in Bryan 
with the Rev. Bob Bray, 
pastor, officiating.

Sic. k< 64 died at 9 II 
a.m. Saturday in the Diagnov 
tic Cenier Hospital in Hous 
ion after a brief illness

Born September 22. 1911 in 
Salem. Oregon, he married 
the former Margaret Reeder 
For the last 21 years, he had 
been a resident of the Bryan 
College Station area. A re 
tired chemical engineer, he 
was head of the Process 
Division of Gulf Oil Corpora 
tion al the time of his retire 
ment. He was also a member 
o f the First Christian Church 
and the Brvan Rotary Club

Survivors include his wife. 
Mrs Paul (Margaret) Siecke 
of Bryan, a niece. M r* R A 
Shaver III of Rochester; a 
nephew, Joe Reeder III of 
Fori Worth; two great 
nephews. Richard and Ross 
Shaver of Rochester: and one 
great niece, Jennifer Shaver, 
also of Rochester.

handle the pruning job vour 
self, hire someone with an 
established operation and 
years of reputation.

10. Have a reason for 
pruning Don't prune just to 
pass the time of day.

Following these simple 
guidelines can save mans 
headaches, heartaches and 
“ butihcred" plants.
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Sheila Cobb Wins
SCS Essay

Sheila Cobb, Knox City 
High School Senior, was 
awarded ihc first place trophy 
this week for her winning 
essay in a contest sponsored 
by the Soil Conservation Ser 
vice.

T h it year's topic was ''Con­
serving Our land After 200 
Years "  Grades 9-12 partici 
paled in the contest, so Sheila 
was competing with 96 other 
rn tran tt.

The second place trophy 
was awarded to Sarah 
McGaughey, and Lisa Coc­
kerell received the third place
trophy.

Award
Sheila's essay w ill be en­

tered in the district contest 
against other first place w in­
ners from all schools in the 
district, where a trophy for 
lirst place will be presented. 
The first place district essay 
will then be entered in the 
Texas Conservation Awards 
Program.

FROM TECH 
Randy F.genbacher was a 

weekend visitor in the home 
ol his parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
John Fgenbacher.

Hr is a student at Texas 
Tech Unlversitv in Lubbocck

—

P A T IE N T  C O U N S E L IN G  
W H AT IS  IT ?

Today's drugs ha»r become so ixm p ie i that H Is 
often necessary to leM or caution you more about your 
prescription than is possible to pul on the label 
Certain foods that should not be enten. other drugs 
that should not be taken at the same lime, how long 
the medicine n UI retain Ht potency T bree are just a 
feu of the mans thing* we might base to ctplain

We nre always reviewing new data that we receive 
about the mans drugs we stock It is our professorial 
responsibility lo  be sure lhal you hare the proper 
information

"A  G R E A T  M A N Y  r E O P U  E N T R U S T  U S  
w ith their prescriptions, health needs and other 
pharmacy products We consider this trust n 
p riv lle fe  and s duty May we he your personal 
fam ily pharmacyT“

m. JONES 
PHARMACY

LOOK,
HOMEOWNERS

If you are having paint problems and are considering doing 
something about it, check into the United States Steel siding 
and insulation.
Choose from 7 beautiful colors. Save $25 to $50 a square.

Solve all your problems at one time including windows and 
doors. Free estimates, including installation. Call

C.W. 'D utch1 Benson Construction
Banjam in. Texas Phonu 817 454-2281 attar 5 p .m .

Lowrey's

run O N E Y E A R  W A R R A N T Y

Boys 6-14 $ 7 . 9 5

Youth 26 thru 30 waists $ 9 . 9 5
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Truscott -  Gilliland 
News

by JIM  CUMLEY

COMMLNITY EVENTS
The Truscott Home De 

nvonstratton Hub met Thur* 
day in the home of Mr* H P. 
Gillespie The program »a* 
on prelecting your home from 
burglar*
AROUND TOWN

Mr and Mr* W 0  Cooler 
are visiting in Abilene this 
weekend.

Guest* of Mr*. Lottie 
Whitaker last weekend were 
Mr and Mr* Charlie Cav in of 
Crowell. Mr* Whitaker aJ»o 
visited her siater-in-law in the 
Seymour hospital

Mr and Mr*. Chester Ko 
berts of Abilene visited Mr* 
Idoma Chowmng here Iasi 
weekend

Mmei E.J. Jones. H.P. 
Gillespie. Idoma Chowmng. 
and Jack Brown attended the 
Columbian Club meeting in 
Crowell and visited ui ihc 
Crowell rest home last week.

Visiting Mr ard Mr* Ho­
mer Martin last week were 
Mr and Mr* Carton Ribble 
of Crowell.

Misty Zeissel of Munday 
spent the weekend with Mr 
and Mr*. D fc. Burges*

The Lloyd Heard family 
visited James Steven* in the 
Otney hospital. Saturday

Rev and Mr* Don Barron 
and son of Eastland vpent 
Sunday afternoon with Mr 
and Mr* Clyde Bullion 

Mr and Mr* W K Owen* 
visited with Mr and Mr* 
John Todd and Mr* J T 
Billmgton in Port Worth last 
week.

Guest* of Mr and Mr* 
Kalph Caram over the week 
end were Albert Caram of 
Arlington and Ereddv Caram 
of Munday

Mr* Emil Navratil has 
returned home from Fort 
Worth w here »he took care of 
her granddaughter while her 
daughter and son in-law Mr 
and Mr*. Terry Hamilton 
went to Miami for the Super 
Bow l

Johnny Burton of Paducah 
visited Mr and Mr* Charle* 
Burton here Saturday

Visitor* of Mr. and Mr* 
W H Havme Friday were 
Mr and Mr* Carl Havme of 
Lubbock Mr and Mr* Ray­
mond Hennan of Wichita 
Fall* came Sunday to help 
celebrate the birthdav of Mr* 
Haynie. and they went to 
Knot City for dinner

Mr* J.C Black and Mr* 
Mildred Cook visited in the 
Crowell rest home Thursday.

BATS-BRUSHES 
BEARINGS

For Hesston, IHC, 
and John Deere 

STRIPPERS
-Also-

Bearings for Krause 
OWENS AUTO SUPPLY

m Awe. ASA 3323

DAIRY MART
MESQUITE COOKED 

BAR-B-QUE
We will begin to 
Bar-B-Que Again 

Tuesday, February 3.

If you want something 
BAR-B-QUED

(Chicken. Roast, Ribs, etc.) 
have it at the Dairy Mart 

before 4:30 p.m. Monday 
It will be ready by 6 p.m. Tuesday.

We will Bar-B-Que 
every week on T uesday

We know you By your nemo-not a number 
CALL-IN ORDERS 6M-B969

29, 1976
Cursts of Mrv Black Satur 
day werr Mr and Mrs. O ltu  
Lash of ICtvoi C«y

Visiting Mr and Mr* Paul 
Horne thi* weekend were 
Teddy Martivn. and M rli**a 
Horne all of Plain view.

Mr and Mr* Jim Ca»h 
visited Mt and Mr* Bill 
Erwin and Mt and Mr* Jack 
Miller in Vernon, Saturday

Mr and Mr* E.J. Jone* 
and Mr* J *  Brown went to 
Duma* for the •'Oth wedJmg 
anniver*ar> ol Mr and Mr*. 
Albert June*

Mr and Mr* A l .  Cook 
had a dinner and invited Mr 
and Mr* Glen McGuire and 
Mr* J.S. Cook 
tLa*t week’* new* • received 
loo late for last week* paper I 
COMMCNITT EVENTS

There wa* a meeting in (he 
Gilliland community center 
Saturday Those present div 
cussed plan* for future musi­
cals

Gilliland revident* would 
like to welcome E 0  Reed to 
Gilliland

The oil well belonging to 
Mr* Jack Brown i t  really 
producing h ia reported that 
it is producing high quality oil 
and natural gas The well t» 
called Brown L *1 by City 
Serv ice.
AROl ND TOWN

Mr and Mr* J D Sewell 
of Fort W'octh visited the Rn 
Glasscock family last week 
end

Mr and Mr* Curtis Case* 
visited in several place* last 
week They went to Knot Citv 
Wednesday and saw Rev and 
Mr* Guy Hopper and Mr* 
Minnie Solomon in the rest 
home In C rowell. they visited 
Rev EG New and Mrv 
Gerrotd in the rest home and 
Mr and Mr* Lester Patton 
and Danny. They alto visited 
Mr* Byron Bate*. M r* B 
Toland. and Mis* Annie 
Chesser in (Juanah

Mr and Mr* Lloyd Heard 
visited James Steven* in the 
Otnev hospital last week 
Thev also visited Mr* Loiv 
Enlow. Mr* Perry Smnh. and 
Mrv Jewel Heard

Mr and Mr* Leonard M i 
er* and son of Amanllo 
visited Mr and Mr* John 
Jamison and Mr and Mr* 
C.C Meet* here last week 
end

Renee Westbrook of Wichi 
ta Fall* visited here wnh her 
family Iasi weekend. Mr and 
Mrs. Tom Westbrook and 
children.

Visitor* of Mr and Mr*
D E Burgess this week were 
Kav White and son of Mid­
land and Barbara Zeissrl of 
Munday.

Mr* Jack Brown and Mr*. 
H P Gillespie attended ihe 
Veteran* Auithary Meeting 
in Munday Thursday night.

Mr* Walter Tavtor of Far- 
ert Valley visited Mr* Guynn 
Hickman last weekend.

Visiting Mr and Mr* W T 
Cook last week werr Mr and 
Mr* Dovle Davu of Wichita 
Fall* and Mr and Mrv 
Richard Winstead of Sey 
mour

Guest* of Mr and Mr* 
C.C Myers last week werr 
Mr and Mrv Claude Myers 
and daughter* of Amanllo

Visitor* in the W K Owen* 
home last weekend were Mr*
J T Billtngton and Mr and 
Mr* John Todd, all of Fort 
Worth

Sec TRUSCOTT, |>K. 7

NOTICE TO VOTERS
I am in the process of mailing

VOTER REGISTRATION 

CERTIFICATES

to all known qualified voters in Knox 
County. If you receive this certifi­
cate, it is your receipt to vote.

If you do not receive one of these, 
call at your City Hall where you will 
receive a voter registration applica­
tion to be filled out and returned to 
my office.

John A. Smith 
To* Asm m ot-Collector

N e w t |

, r °m  »,]
Brazos Veil*,

A FAREW ELL PARTY honoring Mrs Sue H itt, right was hold Tueeday night
by Brazos Valley Care Home personnal Mrs M ill, director of nursee since 1972. 
i i  rasigning to assume the duties of edmin.stralor along with har huaband Carl, 
of the Gibson Memorial Nursing Home In Aspermont She began h*r 
employment here in 1966 Mrs Dora McWhorter, left, has been named to 
succeed Mrs Hitt She received her training at Stamford end has worked both In 
Kno* City and Munday. 0  I White, pictured with the nursee. Is administrator of 
the Brazos Valley Cere Home __ _________________

United Methodist To Observe 
Call To Prayer And Self-Denial

MRS EDNA El Bane

M r* Allen enl cry ,i**tj 
M r*. Parker of Benjamin 

Ben Bingham and wife ^
Elder Henderson of 
were caller* on Mr W *^ -  
at were Ford and FToitw 
O'Brien and Lloyd W a l**  .
Kno* City.

M r* Set fre t of Rule i* 
a new resident al the h.** 
Welcome M r* Sctfrrt!

Ralph and Rose Rav visaed 
his mother. M r*. Ray o* 
their way to Lawton Qkl* 
horn a. and on their return <*, 
their w>ay to their home ta 
Marble Fall*

Mr* Bessie Mae MkhaeU 
of Rik'better was a visitor of 
her slater. Florence Burletoa 
and her daughter. Ed* Fa* 
Pound*.

Nettie Michael* and Mrv 
Alvta were in from Rochcvtr 
to see M r* Kay. M r* Actt* 
and M r* Ballard

Bryce Weaver of Rule paid 
Mr Waldrip a visit 

Mr Lonnie Sctfret and Ton 
Hamilton of Rule iamc bv to "  f*l 
*ee M r*. Set fre t A |

Mr*. Florence Burke of n**«ll 
Seymour visited M r* Rav

Tha
T*s»

rtvat

United Methodist Women 
of First United Methodist 
i hurch of Kno* 1 itv will bold 
one of their most important 
annual observance* nett 
week-The Call to Praver and 
Self Denial About I > million 
women in 3>.000 local unit* in 
all >0 state* will join in the 
observance Locally, both wro- 
mcn and men wilt join in the 
observance

The Call, inspired by spe 
ctai mission need*, focuses on 
prayer, a deepened vptntual 
life and a guided mission 
study Mayor event* of the 
observance include the (Juiet 
Day and an interpretation of 
the mission project* m the 
United States and abroad for 
which a special offering will 
he made Each who takes part 
is asked to give (or other* bv 
denying herself and to culti­
vate through prayer a spin 
tual onenes* with planners, 
mission worker* and those 
served in church related mi 
msisirtes.

The Call lo Praver and Self- 
Denial will be held al ft JO 
p m. on Monday. Kebruarv 2. 
at First United Methodist 
Church • all women invited

The Women s Division of 
the Board of Global Ministries 
of The United Methodist 
Church sponsors the Call to 
Praver and Self-Denial and 
has designated two aapsect*

of the large United Methodist 
mission program to benefit 
from this year's special offer 
mg

The Division says of the 
19’ ft mission aspects:

In the United Slates the 
offering will be used for 

Healing Ministries and Ser­
vices for the A g e d " Through

LOOK
WHO’S
HERE!

Mr and Mrs Gary Pack of 
Lovington. New Meiico are 
ihe proud parents of a baby 
boy bom January 13 at ll:SS 
p m in Hobbs. New Meiico.

The baby has been named 
Gary Lvnn and he weighed 
eight pounds and 12 ounce* 
He measured 21 VS inches 
king

Grandparents are M r and 
M n "  I PM k •! Kno* t in 
and Mr *m! Mr* Waller H
Carroll of Montgomers. Ala- 
bama

Great grandparents include 
Addie and Joe Moody of 
Opelika. Alabama, and Mary 
Simmons of Kno* City.

Lei* Mae and Pete relumed 
home last week after spend 
ing several day* with the 
grandbaby.

the programs and projects 
benefiting from this offering, 
the lives of many senior 
cili/ena will be enriched.

Overseas, the offering will 
he directed toward “ Support 
of Victims of Oppressive So­
cieties and Systems.”  Those 
victim* may be identified as 
political prisoners, ru les, re ­
fugees and women in the 
urban labor force in Asia. 
Africa. Latin America. Pro 
grams include education and 
desefopmrnt. research and 
publication ventures, com­
munity building

The service for the Quirt 
Day. "And All These Things 
Shall Be Added. ...”  was w rit­
ten by Margaret Tyrrell (Mrs 
J Boyd), retired staff mem­
ber of the Women's Division 
of the Board of Global M inis­
tries of The United Methodist 
Church.

United Methodist Women 
i* the successor body lo two 
former denominational wo 
men's groups the Women's 
Society of Christian Service 
and the Wesleyan Service 
Guild, and is related to the 
Women'* Division of ihe 
Board of Global Ministries of 
The United Methodist 
Church Last year the Call to 
Praver and Self Denial offer 
ings of United Methodist 
Women totaled approxi- 
mairly *700.000

KNOX BUILDERj

PAN ELI H
Number One M! 
Plywood Panelinj

Benjamin Plans Tree 
Planting Ceremony

A special tree planting 
ceremony will be held at the 
Kno* County Courthouse in 
Benjamin Frulai at 10 30 
am.

The program is sponsored 
bv Ihe Benjamin Bicentennial 
Committee, the Texas Forest 
Service and the Texas Fores­
try Association a* an official 
Amcruan Revolution Burn 
lennial project

Highlight of the ceremony 
will be the dedication and 
planting of a “ Liberty Tree" 
by Benjamin M an* Vernon 
D Mc< anliev 

The Liberty Tree is a 
"T r|**" variety pecan Pecan 

is the state tree of Texas and

“ Tejas”  is a new variety 
which grows well throughout 
the state and produces abun 
dant shade and tasty fruit

Thi* Bicentennial pecan is 
called a Liberty Tree after the 
famous elm in colonial Boston 
under which the first act of 
public resistance occurred in 
|7b.S the hanging in effigy of 
a newly-appointed stamp tax 
officer This tree was a sym 
bol of resistance to British 
rule, and mans towns planted 
or dedicated thew own Liberty 
Tree*.

Participating in the event 
w ill be Ihe Benjamin School

The public is inslted lo 
attend.

START A GOOD PART-TIME J08 
BEFORE GRADUATION.

You (fon t have to wait for your high school diploma to 
atari a good job You can he working at a guud part tune job 
while sou re still a senior ( all your local Arms Krwrve unit 
for (triads

TH E AR M Y RESERVE.nwr OF WHAT YOU EARN B PM*

f
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Ag Mark, please don't cry 
-cause we won't be there.
K?

FHA NEWS 
By Sandy Stubbs

The FHA organization had 
a meeting January 22. At this 
meeting the group discussed 
and planned many different 
event*. *uch a* Uaddv Date 
Night, Area meeting, and 
State meeting Timilu Gra­
ham was chosen voting dele­
gate for the .Area meeting in 
Strphenville.

A skit titled II AC was 
presented. | LAC stands for 
I'm  Loving and Capable. It 
emphasized that everyone has 
good qualities if  one takes 
time to look for them. Each 
time a person is unkind to 
another they tear their ILAC 
or destroy some of their 
self-confideniel The girls in 
the skit were Pam Skilcs. 
Debbie Ray, Patti Lain. Je­
well Culbervm. Sarah 
McGaughey, and Marylon 
Bun

FFA NEWS
By Brett Boone

We are all now anticipating 
the Fort Worth Show. Hope­
fully, we will all enjoy it and 
do well. It is now just a week 
away.

We hope the Freshmen 
enjoy it because Monday we 
had an officers meeting to 
decide when. what, and how 
about (Gasp) INITIATION!

So all the lucky Greenhands 
should be looking forward to 
this occasion. (Hint: If I were 

! a Greenhand I would wear 
some clothes that I never 

! wanted to wear again).

— ........ ...  111

. ■
P. PATTERSON, Paetor
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I LUNCHROOM | 
MENUS

b r e a k f a s t  m e n u s
FEBRUARY 2-4, 1*7* 
Mondayi Orange Wedges. 
Peanut Butter Whip. But­
tered Toast. Milk 
Tnoadayi Orange Juice. Pan­
cakes with Butter and Syrup. 
Milk
Wednesday! Grape Juice. Ba­
con. Buttered Toast with Jel­
ly. Milk
TBaraday: Orange Juice.
Scrambled Eggs, Buttered 
Toast with Jelly. Milk 
Friday: Applesauce. Cinna­
mon Toast, M ilk

LUNCH MENUS 
FEBRUARY 2-*, 1*7*
Monday: Oven Fried Fish. 
Macaroni and Cheese. Black- 
eyed Peas. Chilled Peaches. 
Thick Sliced Toast. Cookies, 
Milk
Tuesday: Hamburger or
Cheeseburger. Burger Trim ­
mings. Baked Beans. Potato 
Chips, Purple Plum Cobbler. 
Milk
Wednesday i Pinto Beans with 
Ham. Seasoned Squash. To­
mato Relish, Jello with Fruit. 
Hot Corn Bread with Butter. 
Milk
Thursdayi Frito Pie. Combi­
nation Salad. Oven Fried 
Potatoes. Hot Batter Bread 
with Butter. Brownies, Milk 
Friday. Fried Chicken. 
Whipped Potatoes. Gravy. 
Pea Salad. Hot Rolls with 
Butter, Honey, Milk

Basketball
Results

JUNIOR HIGH GIRLS
Crowell 45
Knox City |9

Gaylynn Burkham 13
Kay Howell 3
Belinda Rogers 2
Tammy Helton I

SATURDAY VISITORS
Visiting with the Grady 

Benedicts Saturday afternoon 
were their nieces. Mrs. Sybil 
Simmons of Gilliland and 
Mrs. Bobbie Kinmbrough of 
Floydada.

They also visited with the 
Buddy Angles.

Hocus Pocus
THURSDAY • FRIDAY  

SATURDAY

PRESTON BREAD45cLarge
Loaf

MR. PIBB
32 oz. (Returnable) 

Deposit required

32c

PLANTS Bunch 32c
ON HAND -  ONION SETS TO ARRIVE SOON

W E ACCEPT U S. FOOO STAMPS

l u n w u i i i i J U J i i m i i m 1 i t j

Seniors Of The Week
And Thtir Autobiographic*

Coaches' Comments

SHERRY 0R IN D 8TA FF

Sherry Grindstaff was born 
October  h. 1958 in Haskell. 
Texas. Her parents are Mr 
and Mrs. Sammy Grindstaff 
of Knos City and Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Summers of Abi­
lene.

Sherry attended school in 
Abilene until she was th ir­
teen. In the summer of I97|, 
Sherry moved to Columbus. 
Ohio where she lived for three 
scars. She is now attending 
Knos City High School.

In her junior and senior 
years, Sherry was a member 
of Pan American Student 
Forum and in her junior year 
she was a member of Future 
Homemakers of America.

Sherry is to be married on 
February 21 to Felix Garcia. 
The couple is planning to live 
in O'Brien Sherry is planning 
to finish high school.

January 29 andJIi Jr. High 
Basketball Tournament at 
Knox City. Boys and Girls. 
Rule, Rochester. Munday and 
Knox City
January 30: Crowell plays 
Here, 5 p.m. GGB 
February 2: Jr. High at
Haskell BGB. 5 p m. 
February 3: Haskell here. 
BGB 5 p.m.
February 3: Assembly Pro 
gram on Puppets, 2 p.m.

USEFUL DIRECTORY
There’s good news for 

people who would like to 
know how to reach public 
relations directors o f big cor­
porations. A new book lists 
the PR setup o f 1,293 o f the 
largest U. 8 companies

In some corporations PR 
department executives handle 
corporate contributions, and 
those names are handy for 
fund-raising groups to have at 
their fingertips.

The book, The I97i> 
O'Dwytr't Directory of Cor- 
poratr Commumcaltont. is 
the most extensive survey 
ever undertaken o f how 
America's largest companies 
have defined, organized and 
staged their PR operations

Jack O'Dwyer, an author­
ity  on the field o f PR. put in 
six months o f hard labor 
compiling the 195 page 8*4 x 
11-inch directory It <v>«t* 
$55 and can be ordered from 
the J. R O'Dwyer Company, 
271 Madison Avenue, New 
York, N Y 10016. It's the 
most compiehensive who's 
why in American corporate 
public relations you can get.

J IM M Y  HELM S

Jimmy Helms was born in 
Arlington. Texas, on Julv 12. 
I9sh, lo Mr and Mrs. John E 
Helms.

He was born the third child 
of the family, being preceded 
by an older brother, Johnny, 
and sister. Karen

At the age of two years, 
Jimmy moved to Knox City 
with the rest of his family. 
After living in Knox City for 
four years, he was rewarded 
with a baby sister, Diane.

Jimmy has been active in 
the high school hand for four 
years, one-act play one year, 
and UIL typing one year. 
Jimmy also had his poetry 
published in the National 
Anthology of High School 
Poetry.

Jimmy's favorite movie was 
“ Tommy" and his favorite 
color is blue.

Once out of school, 
Jimmy's only ambition is to 
work and save his money.

FROM SNYDE R
Joey Swain, student at 

Western Texas College in 
Snyder, visited over the week­
end with his parents. Mr and 
Mrs Cliff Swam.

ATI E NDS MARKET 
Henry White was in Dallas 

Iasi weekend attending mar­
ket at the Apparel Mart.

Bv JERRY LOWRKY
The Greyhounds have put 

together three of their belter 
games of the season in the 
last three outings but. yet. 
have lost all three games. 
Haskell took the first by a 
score of 17) 59. next Paducah 
MJ to KC's t*9, and finally 
Munday't 7|-.s* victory. We 
were in all three of these 
games all the way through 
and with a bucket or two at 
the right time could have won 
any of the three games. In any 
of the three games we weren't 
hitting real well, hitting 402 in 
the Haskell game, 39% a 
gainst Paducah and finally 
2b% in lhe Munday game

We face the two district 
leaders this week in Asper- 
inonl and Crowell. These two 
boys' trams tied for the first 
half championship

One thing I feel the Hounds 
should he commended for m 
these past games is their 
attitude and fighting sptrti. 
After getting off to s poor 
start against Munday and 
Aspermont they came on in 
these last three games and 
really got after the Indians. 
Dragons, and Moguls I feel it 
shows the character of the 
players that we have, which is 
certainly one of which we can 
he proud After all. ihe true 
test of a person is not during 
times of prosperity or during 
Ihe good times, hut rather a 
person's real character is 
shown during hard times or 
during adversity. Whether 
you win or lose is secondary to 
lh< .e traits because if you do 
your best, then you will 
always be a winner and no 
one has ihe right to ask for 
more

By STEPHEN MCILHANEY

Last week we played two 
games which could have easi­
ly been the best games that 
we played all year We played 
well both offensively and 
defensively and we held our 
mental errors to a minimum 
With the district as balanced

as il is. we will nerd to 
continue to play the rest of 
our games this way. If we 
have a let down, we could 
easily be out of the district 
race.

We can give credit to our 
guards for part of our recent 
success In the district games 
so far we are allowing our 
opponents only thirty-seven 
points per game This can be 
attributed to good defensive 
play and a lot of hustle. We 
have kept out of foul trouble 
which ha* helped greatly.

Offensively we are working 
the hall very well. This has 
helped lo keep the opposing 
defense off balance and allow 
us lo get the needed points to 
win. We are also shooting a 
good percent age from the 
flour while gelling the needed 
points from the free throw 
tine.

If we can continue to play 
with the hustle and intensity 
that we have for the last few 
games we could be in a 
district play-off in two weeks 
But if we have any type of let 
down we could he in for 
trouble We will need a super 
• Mon from all player* to have 
a chance for the district 
i hampionship Hope to see 
you at the next game

LOOK
WHO’S
HERE!

Mr and Mrs Bob Boone of 
Seymour are the proud 
parent* of a baby girl born 
Saturday. January 17, at 3.27 
p m in Wichita General Hos­
pital in Wichita Falls

The young miss has been 
named Rebecks Jo. She 
weighed sis pounds and I4 Vi 
ounces and measured l9 ‘/ i  
inches long

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr and Mrs Joe Roy Smith 
and paternal grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs Claude 
Boone of Seymour.

Paternal great-grandlaiiict 
is G.F. Boone of Seymour.

Mr and Mrs. Darrell Par­
ker are Ihe proud parents of a 
baby girl horn January 20 in 
Hendruk Memorial Hospital
in Abilene.

They have named the baby 
Rhonda Lee and she weighed 
in at five pounds and !4*/i 
ounces. The young miss mea­
sured 19 inches long

Grandparents are Mr and 
Mrs Cecil Paine of Haskell 
and Mrs. ti l lie  Parker of 
Munday.

f ROM DENTON
Debbie Bishop. Texas Wo­

men’s University student at 
Denton, spent Ihe weekend 
here with her parents. Mr 
and Mrs Kenneth Russell 
and Ricky.

PA N CAKE
SUPPER

Friday Jan. 30
4:30-4:30

SCHOOL C AFETER IA  
$1.25

Sponsored by
K .C  BROW NIES

THRIFTY OFFICE EQUIPMENT
CO M PLETE SA LES & SER V ICE

P.0. Box 1828 
Vernon, Texas

For local service, call 658 3142 
or leave machine at 

The Knox County News

■ • l i a b i l i t y  i n  Y e a r  

W h y  l e t t b  f o r  L t t i

■ I n n ?  

H i e  B M t t

W h e r e  Y o u r  S a v in g *  I n t e r e t i  b  

C om p o u n de d  D o lly -P a id  Q u a rte rly

ON THI GROW
To Bo**or Servo Tee

* 4 2 , 0 0 0 , 0 0 0
M m  In  A m f t

Aawxxal Rato Aaweal Y ie ld

PASSBOOK 5.25% 5.39%
M-DAY NOTICE I M N  
CERTIFICATE MINIMUM 5.75% 5.92%
12 Mo CERTIFICATE 
ll.M ta a  M INIMUM 6.50% 6.72%
30-Mo CERTIFICATE 
l l  .Wa M Mlalmawt 6.75% 6.98%
44 Mo CERTIFICATE 
II.4M .M  MINIMUM 7.50% 7.79%
73 Mo INVESTMENT 
CERTIFICATE 7.75% 8.06%

>

$1 .M .N M IN IM U M  DEPOSIT:
Renewable Comp— dad Dally and PaM 
Qeerterly
A aabelaaiial Inter eat »e m its h 
early wtUWawal

! RETIRED
CUSTOMERS

R E T IR E D  CUSTOMERS CAN HAVE
SOCIAL SECURITY CHECKS SENT DIRECT 
FOR DEPOSIT IN A SAVINGS ACCOUNT 
WHERE IT CAN EARN INTEREST UNTIL 

-  NEEDED CONTACT ONE OF OUR OFFICES

I
 TO LEARN MORE ABOUT THIS NEW WAY TO 
SAVE MONEY

„ !

INDIVIDUAL 
RETIREMENT 
ACCOUNTS

IN D IV ID U A L  R E T IR E M E N T  ACCOUNTS
ARE NOW AVAILABLE FOR YOU TO SET 
ASIDE UP TO 11.500 00 INCOME PER YEAR 
TAX DEFERRED IN YOUR SAVINGS 
ACCOUNT WHERE IT WILL EARN INTEREST 
UNTIL WITHDRAWN FOR RETIREMENT DO 
IT NOW AND MAKE YOUR RETIREMENT 
EASIER TO LIVE WITH

FIRST FEDERAL SAVINGS AND 
LOAN ASSOCIATION

K IP Home Of See i to sack Office
I22W . McHarg «1 A vee«  D
P.O. boa SI I p .o .  box 444
Stamford, Texaa 7MS) Haskell, Texaa 79521

444-117*

M  via low Office i 
Qaaeah Federal S a v lM  
a ad Loaa
l i t  Sm ith  M a la  S t.
Qua a ah, Texaa 79252



PAG£ s2X k » a x  C0C3TTT \ n ?  i * m r '  ■*. » ' •

___  i i i
■  *■;

I

t  *

i l l s

BANQUET
CH ICKEN  B EEF-T U tK |Y

POT PIES

f i N n i U  

German Chocolate

CHEER
DETERGENT

15
Giant Size

MR. COFFEE
FILTERS

N S 2 5

c u M

k *

NORTHERN

51 ct

bathroom w

TISSUE
Auo*f»d Cc c*i

•  » O i i  
* A C * t

l  6 .

9 1  MILK
I GAL eiASTK  JUG

Kourrty Kist

SWEET PEAS

5 -Lb.
SagFLOUR

-A*?

' " iS *i

•l;

MORION
WAFFLE 8 9  
SYRUP

NIBLETS CORN
12 az.

c o t g a ^ f

V

C0L6I1
* s e • *: esi|

i n

PREU
S k e w s  

3 o i .  K t «  ml

harvest brand

BACON

BAYU
Aspirn 

IOC ct :• i
m

i #  P k 9

t :

*C s jin

, v

■  m

tiuoem

ONIONS
* • * * 4

CRACKERS
!■». .  5 9

Family Steak

Turbot

FISH FILLET
Boneless $ 

Fillets

GROUND

LETTUCE
YELLOW SQUASH

l o t h
- W E ...

S Y'Pork Si
r  ‘ /

f

l l l l l l l ' i s t
it.



■ •nd Mr*. Sonny Butkin vi- 
led relatives in Oklahoma 
er the weekend.
Mrs. Bill Hamilton and 

Gary returned home Sunday 
after several day* visit in Fort 
Worth and the Sherman area

Mrs. Gertrude Brannan 
and Johnny were in Wichita 
Falls Thursday for Johnny to 
have a physical check-up.

Mr. and Mrs. John Cos and 
John Jr. left recently for their 
new home in the state of 
Louisiana. They will be there 
a short while before going on 
to Fort Campbell. Kentucky 
to live.

Bryan Bumpas of VRJC 
visited friends here over the 
weekend.

Frank Morrow of Vernon 
visited his mother, Mrs. Ilene 
Morrow over the weekend.

IN DALLAS
Mrs. John Kgenbacher, 

Mrs. Butch Stephens, and 
1 Mrs. Hlmo Stephens were in 

Dallas last weekend at the 
Apparel Mart for market.

FROM LUBBOCK
Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Beason 

of Lubbock visited here over 
' |  the weekend with their pa­

rents, Mr. and Mrs. W Leo 
Beason and Mr. and Mrs. 

I  Charlie Clarke.

ICE
/one who encour- 
Commissioner of 

3ve decided not to

Thank you, 
Raymond Wilhite

MOTOR CO.
Pbooe AM-3511

C ity

PROGRESS

Miss King Honored 
In Z.l. Smith Home

Miss Carol King, bride- 
elect of Howard Skinner, was 
honored with a g if' tea Satur­
day in the home of Mrs. Z.L 
Smith. Calling hour was from 
three to four in the afternoon

Mrs. Smith greeted guests 
and presented them to the 
honoree; her mother, Mrs. 
Erwin King Jr.; and the 
prospective bridegroom's mo­
ther, Mrs. L.A. Skinner.

Miss Gayle Tankersley and 
Mrs, Greg Zcissel served 
refreshments from a table 
covered with a blue cloth and 
centered with an antique 
crystal compote holding blue 
carnations. Appointments of

crystal and silver were used.
Hostesses were Mmes. 

Smith, Judy Allen of Fort 
Worth. J.C. McGee, Ulric 
Lea, Jack Lankford. Joe 
Clonts and Diane, Sammy 
Tankersley and Gayle. C.G. 
Clarke. Bruce Campbell Jr.. 
Celso Gonzales, J.C. Eaton. 
Tommy Kent, Don Railsback. 
Willard Skiles. Bits Whitten. 
Frank Woodall. Lewis Kay of 
O'Brien, David Albus, Joe 
Boone. John Egenbacher, 
Jack Stubbs, Greg Zeissel, 
Jim Pratt of Benjamin. 
Charles Lankford. John E. 
Helms. Arche Lieb. and Sam­
my B. White.

Kutters Have Dance, 
Elect Club Officers

The KC Kutters. Knos 
City's square dance organisa­
tion. has elected officer* for 
this year.

Named to serve at last 
month's meeting were Z.L 
and Mary Beth Smith as 
president; Bob and Bobbie 
Harrison as vice-president; 
and Billy Gene and Dean 
Johnston as secretary.

The Kutters also had their 
regular dance Saturday night 
and according to a spokesman 
about eight squares per 
formed.

Hosts for the monthly 
dance were Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Clonts. Mr. and Mrs. Buster 
Lowrey and Jan. and Mr. and 
M rs. Leonard Morgan and 
Judy.

W.J. (Bill) Townsends 
Note 40th Anniversary

Mr. and Mrs W.J. (Bill) 
Towrnsend w ill celebrate their 
40th wedding anniversary 
Sunday, February I, from 
2:00 to 4:00 p.m. with a 
reception in their home eight 
miles southeast of Vera.

The reception will be

T R U S C O T T
from page four

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Shook of 
Wichita Falls visited the Elmo 
Shaw tainily last weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Heard 
attended the Knos County 
4 H Club banquet in Mundav 
Thursday night.

Guests in the Jim Cash 
home last weekend were Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Cash of Grand- 
field. Oklahoma.

Mr and Mrs. L.D. Welch 
went to Jacksboro Sunday for 
the funeral of Mrs. Welch's 
uncle.

Visiting Mr and Mrs N.L. 
Loonev Sunday were Mr and 
Mrs. Steve Gray of Vernon.

Kristen Corder of Knos 
City spent the weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. W.O. Corder.

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
John Jamivrn over the week­
end were Mr. and Mrs "A.L. 
Patterson and children of 
Wichita Falls.

There was a birthday pany 
given for Mrs, Eston New 
Sunday night at the Gilliland 
Baptist Church.

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Ro­
berts of Abilene visited Mrs. 
Idoma Chowning last week­
end.

Mr. and Mrs. A.R Bayers 
visited Mr and Mrs. John 
Thomson in Vernon and Mr. 
and Mrs. Adolph Bartos in 
Burkburnett last week

FROM WTSU
David N. McGaughcy, stu­

dent at West Tesas State 
University in Canyon, visited 
over the weekend with his 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. John 
N. McGaughcy, Jodie and 
Barhie.

hosted by their two daugh 
lers. Mrs. Billy Kinnibrugh of 
Vera and Mrs. Barbara 
Coulston of Odessa and their 
families.

Mrs. Townsend, the former 
Nora Mae Morris, and W.J. 
Townsend were united in 
marriage in Vera February 2. 
19.1b. They lived on the Bill D. 
Baker Ranch near Lueders 
until 1942 when they moved 
to the farm where they now 
live.

The Townsends have five 
grandchildren.

The Tesas Department of 
Public Safety advises that all 
Tesas drivers should esaminr 
their Tesas drivers license to 
verify that the address on 
their license is correct. If his 
address is incorrect, it w ill be 
necessary to contact the local 
Drivers License Office as soon 
as possible. It is a misde­
meanor offense for not chang­
ing \our address within 10 
days after moving. This parti­
cular law is going to be 
enforced more strictly in the 
future. The procedure for 
changing an address on a 
license is to have a duplicate 
license made with a new 
picture and a one dollar fee.

The Drivers License Law. 
V.C.S. b6K7b. Sec. 20, states 
that whenever any person 
after applying for or receiving 
an Operator's. Commercial 
Operator's or Chauffeur's li­
cense shall move from the 
address named in such appli 
cation or in the license issued 
to him or when the name of 
the licensee is changed by 
marriage or otherwise, such 
person shall within ten (10) 
days thereafter notify the 
Department in writing of his 
old and new addresses or of 
such former and new names.

IN CROWNOVER HOME
Mr and Mrs. Mike Collins- 

worth of 1*1800. Mr and Mrs. 
Joe Smith. Scott and 
Stephanie of Canyon, and Mr. 
and Mr*. Art Crownover of 
Amarillo were weekend 
guests of their parents. Mr. 
and Mrs. John Crownover.

FROM FORT WORTH
Visiting in the home of the 

Z.l. Smiths over the weekend 
were their daughter and 
grandson, Judy Allen and 
Colby of Fort Worth.

Another weekend visitor in 
the Smith home was Mrs. 
Smith's mother. Mrs. Nomah 
Francisco, also of Fort Worth.

of the the number of any 
license then held by him. and 
such person shall apply for a 
duplicate license as set out in
section 14.

Section 14 states that in the 
eveni that an Operator's. 
Commercial Operator's or 
Chauffeur's license issued 
under the provisions of (his 
A d  is lost, destroyed or there 
is a change in pertinent 
information, the person to 
whom the same was issured 
may obtain a duplicate or 
correction thcrof upon fur­
nishing proof satisfactory to 
the Department that such 
permit or license was lost or 
destroyed or upon the supply­
ing of the required informa­
tion which has changed, to­
gether with proff acceptable 
to the Department supporting 
such change, and upon the 
payment of a fee of one dollar.

IN LUBBOCK
Mr. and Mrs. James Hewitt 

and Melinda, accompanied by 
Mark Howell, were in Lub 
bock over the weekend visit 
ing with their sons and their 
families. Mr. and Mrs David 
Hewitt and Clay and Mr. and 
Mrs. Mike Hewitt.

Drivers Should Check 
Address On License
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TRUSCOTT BICENTENNIAL COINS
The Truscott Bicentennial Commission

is now taking orders for 
Truscott Bicentennial Coins

THESE COINS W ILL  DEPICT A M AP OF THE W IC H IT A  D IV ID E, 
BOUNDED BY THE NORTH AND SOUTH W IC H ITA  RIVERS, W IT H  A 
M A P  OF KNO X COUNTY ON THE REVERSE. DESIGNER. M IC H A E L 
HUTTON OF W IC H IT A  FALLS

BIDS
THE COMMISSION IS NOW TAKING SEALED BIDS. $100 M IN IM U M  
BID, ON 4-COIN SETS NUMBER 1-6. BIDDING CLOSED AT 5 P M . 
MARCH 1. 1976 RIGHT RESERVED TO REJECT ANY AND ALL BIDS. 
M AIL TO BIDS. TRUSCOTT BICENTENNIAL COMMISSION. TRUSCOTT, 
TEXAS 79260.

A ll coin* In this limited series are numbered.
Other coins avallablo Include

4-coin sots (no. 6 and up) $100 plus las
(1 gold plated, 1 silver. 1 brushed silver. 1 bronze)

2-coln set $15 plus las
( 1 brushed sliver, 1 bronze)

Gold com $50 plus tax
Silver coin S2S plus tax

(above sets and single coins come in a numbered lucite case which can be 
Imprinted w ith your name lor S3 50 extra.)
Brushed silver coin $5 00 plus tax
Antique Bronze coin S3 50 plus tax

M ail ardors add $1.00 to each order for Insurance end handling
M ail chock and orders to

TRUBCOTT BICENTENNIAL CO M M IM IO N. TRUSCOTT. TEXAS 79260 
A very lim ited number of 4-coln proof sots w ill bs available 

Inquire Truscott Bicentennial Commission. Truecott. Texas 79260
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Bradfords Celebrate 
66th Anniversary

Mr. and Mrs. Ben Jradturd 
celebrated their bblh Wed­
ding Anniversary Sunday 
with a luncheon in their honor 
at their home

The Bradfords were mar­
ried January 2b, 1910, and 
many of their family and a few 
clove friendv joined them lor 
the day.

Children of the couple at

SS News
Persons who plan to apply 

for supplemental vecunty in 
come payments can save time 
by first getting together vome 
information about them­
selves. according to Carl Bets- 
ncr. Social Security claimv 
representative from Vernon

The supplemental Security 
income program makes 
monthly payments to persons 
with little or no income and 
limited resources who arc bb 
or over or blind or disabled 
Persons can get information 
abouut applying for the pay­
ments by calling or writing 
any social security office.

"W hen applying." Bcisner 
said, " it 's  a good idea to have 
with you as many of the 
following as possible: a check 
book, if  you have one. to show 
how much you have in the 
bank, any savings account 
books, stocks and bonds, life 
insurance policies, automo­
bile registration cards, latest 
real estate tax statements if 
you own a home or any land, 
last year's income lax return. 
W-2 forms, and evidence of 
all other income.”

It may save time. too. 
according to Beisner. tf those 
applying lor supplemental se­
curity income payments know 
how much cash they have on 
hand and know the value of 
their car. i f  they own one.

"You should also have your 
social security card ”  he said 
"Disabled or blind students 
18 to 22 should have a school 
identification card, tuition re­
ceipts. or similar evidence of 
school attendance. '*

The supplemental security 
income program is adminis­
tered by the Social Security 
Administration, an agenev of 
the U.S. Department of 
Health, Education, and Wel­
fare The Vernon Social Secu­
rity Office is at 1701 Cumber­
land. The phone number is 
tHI 7) SS2-9J4to

FROM DUMAS 
Mrs. Barnev Beasley. Holli 

and Brett of Dumas, have 
returned home after a two 
week stay with her parents, 
Mr and Mrs. Kenneth 
(row noser.

tending were Mr. and Mrs 
Otis Clarion ol Abilene. Mr 
and Mrs John W Bradford of 
Appleton. Wisconsin. Mr 
and Mr*. Joe Hollen ol Mid 
land, and Mr and Mrs Ken 
Bradford ol Knox City.

Grandchildren of the 
honored couple atiendmg in­
cluded Mr and Mrs. James 
Hopkins ol Fori Worth, Mr 
and Mrs. Chuck Roberts and 
Kandy, Benny David Brad 
ford, and Johnny Bradford, 
all of Knox City, and Mr and 
M»s Kenneth Duane Brad 
ford of Dallas

Other guests included 
Ben's brother. Curtis Brad- 
lord. and Mr and Mrs Willte
Garrett, all of Crowell, and 

Mr and Mrs D L Owens of
Knox City.

WEEKEND g u e s t s  
Visiting over the weekend 

wuh Mr, and Mrs. Doug 
Meinzer and Tyke and Mrs. 
lewis Etoyd were Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Skiles and family 
ol Hamlin. Bink Bowen and 
Mr. and Mrs. Ariel Pointer 
and Debbie of Abilene.

IN COATS HOME
Visiting in the Jack Coats 

home recently were their 
granddaughters and their 
families. Mr. and Mrs Jimmy 
Faulk and children of Ablilene 
and Mr and Mra Charles 
Prewit of Haskell.

W ALL VISITORS
Visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 

H E . Wall Sunday were his
sister. M r* Est* Cobb of 
Haskell and Mrs. J.D. 
Gillispie of Stamford

GOING
EA RLY

Winter is the tim e to have 
your lawn and garden pow ­
ered equ ipm ent put into 
peak opera ting  cond ition  
by

CITY HARDW ARE
Knox City 656-3222

AUTMORII9 0  IBVlCI OBNTBR

1

C )u\ y«jy will he mnte complete 

if  you could he with us 

to help celebiate th*

^fiftieth ClVtJJinq * 7nrui'rts<i»y

of out patents

3l> and SUu X. C. Jwt
ikum/ay, the /itif <»/ UvAtuaty 

nineteen /|um /iei/ and iei<enty-ux 

f\orn thlee to five o •clock

Club

^Benjamin, Uexas I

Calvin Brown. Lois W alls . Stanton Brown 
Trum an Brown. Daisy Roberts 

Vela Jan W h itm ire  and Veba Nan Jones

M i

I t
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Save for w hat you
SUPER

KNOX CITY

DOUBLE
S & H GREE N  S T A M P S  

W E D N E S D A Y S  
With The Nr(k«i(
04 W SO Or Mere

SPECIALS 600D  
THURS.HM.SAT. 
JAN. 29-30-31

BANQUET FRIED

CHICKEN
"Heot *N S«r»*''g

2 - L B . B O X  I

M . 8 9

e e ” S y s t

DIAMOND
RED DELICIOUS

A P P L E S

s » o u _____ 3 9 (

Pound* SI.00
_  P a s c a l ^ "  C e le r y  _ _ _

S u n k is t  T a n g e r in e s  4  _ _____

H  F r e s h  C o r n ____________8  i° i_  $1 .00

m C a l i f .  O ra n g e s  _ 5  Pound* . $1 .00
■ m l___________ _____________________ ___________  ___  _____________ ______________

SHORTEN

K O U N T R Y  FR ES H

M I L K
CAUON PLASTIC JUC

■ sidired-Feb.4 ,1976 _

IEH0N Fill
j o y !
L IQ U lV
CIANT

U y

FOLGER' S I NSTANT

COFFEE____
_  DEL MONTE FRESH

™ w°'°uPICKLES
COLD TABLETS

?  DRISTAN__
S ,  J A J BABY

i  SHAMPOO
WELCH CRAPE

26 oz. JAR

GIVI

10oz. JAR ? 2 .4 9
4 9 <  

24 COUNT 5 1 . 2 9
7 oz. BOTTLE •J.15

SCOT PAPER
TO W ELS

D E L  M0N1
YELLOW Cl!

SMOKED
PICNICS
CARL'S SAUSAGE. R E G . OR HOT J  LB.

longhorn cheese I  Z  ft,
MEATY SPARE RIBS_______ ^


