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With rangelands and wheat 
fields dry to the point of 
brittleness before this week­
end. area residents were smil 
mg broadly.

On Sunday. Knoa City re­
ceived a total of 1.00 with 
another .7S falling on M on­
day. bringing the two day 
total to 1.7$. Knot City, along 
with Anvm  and Merkel 
totaled an inch or more the 
first day. /

The weekend rain started 
as a mist, went to a steady 
rain and then back to a long, 
eaay fall which placed the 
moisture evenly and produced 
little or no runoff, a benefit to 
farmers and ranchcra.

Knoa City had the most 
recorded rainfall in the Big 
Country as 1.35 inches fell at 
Goree. I hO at Anson. 1.20 at 
Avoca, NO at DeLeon. 1.10 at 
Haskell, 1.00 at Rockdale and 
Gorman. 1.70 at Merkel, and 
I SO at Seymour.
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Gam e, Fish 
Hearings Set
W IC H IT A  FA LLS  During the 
week of March 22-26. Texas 
Parks and Wildlife Depart 
mrnt officials will conduct 
public hearings across the 
state to present proposed 
changes in some game and 
fish regulations, and to cite 
biological justification for the 
changes.

The hearings are the first 
step toward setting regula­
tions in those Texas counties 
under PAW L) regulatory au 
thorny.

Detailed repoiu  on tut 
public's comments at these 
hearings are forw arded to the 
Parks and Wildlife Commis 
'ton. along with proposed 
changes, for their considera­
tion.

The Parks and Wildlife 
Commission is slated to act on 
the proposed changes at their 
April 23 public meeting in 
Austin.

All interested citizen* are 
urged to attend the hearing in 
their area and make their 
opinions known

The public hearing for 
Knox County will he held in 
Benjamin at the courthouse 
on March 22. 197b at 10 00 
a m .

A S S U M IN G  D U T IE S  AS M A N A O E R  O F  B O B 'S  S U P E R  S A V E  this w e *  ia Gus
Cowart, righ t, formerly o' Lameaa, who is shown with Bob Harrison, owner M r 
Harrison's two businesses. B o b 's Super Save and W e s Tex Coupon Clearing 
House, have grow n to the extent that M r Harrison is no longer able to do justice 
to both firm s and will now devote his time to the clearing house

Cowart Is Bob's New Manager
Mon )’ig things arc 

continuing lo happen in Knoi
City

Along with the addition of 
new businesses lo the town, 
two firms under the owner 
ship of Bob Hamson. Hob v 
Super Save and W e s-Tri 
Coupon Clearing House, have 
enjovrd such growth the past 
few 'cars that Mr Hamson 
fimK he can no longer do 
justice lo both businesses 
Therefore, he lias named Gus 
Cowart as manager of Hob's 
Super Save Mr Harrison 
a m  plans to devote all of his 
iifc-ie to the rapidly eapanding 
coupon clearing firm.

Mr. Cowart, a Lamcsa na
ttve. who has been in the 
grocers business since I9>|, 
is well experienced, having 
owned and operated his own 
B m a ,_______________

CC Ladies To 
Sponsor Tourney

The Ladies' Association of 
the Knox City Country Club is 
xponsonng a Bridge and Ca 
nasta Tournament on Fndav. 
March 19. beginning at n 
p m  at the Country Club

The tournament ix for both 
men and women--just bring a 
partner of your choice.

Delicious pies, cakes, and 
sandwiches will he sold Pri 
res will be given-including a 
door prue.

Fntry deadline is Wcdnes 
day. March 17. and the entry 
fee is given in the displav ad 
appeanng elsewhere in this 
week's edition.

He assumed hit new duties 
here Monday of this week and 
is looking forward to moving 
his family here as soon as 
school is out Mr. Cowart's 
wife. Mane, is a native of 
Abilene and they are the 
parents of two children. 
Karen, a high school junior, 
and K rllv . a sixth grader The 
family belongs to the Church 
of Christ.

Bill Anderson 
Receives His 
30 Year Pin

Bill Anderson recently re­
ceived his thiny year award 
pm from Amoco Production 
( ompanv.

Bill began working for 
Amoco February 6. 1946. in 
Brownfield upon his return 
from North Africa where he 
served in the l),S . Air Force 
.luring World War II He has 
been in Knos City since he 
was transferred from Far 
nunglon. New Mexico. March 
I. 1954

Hill, his wife. Judy and son. 
David, a sophomore at Knos 
City High School, reside at 
1107 South Fourth

The Andersons have two 
other children. including their 
son. Mark his wife. Pal and 
iheir daughter. Casey, who 
live in Johnson CLity, and 
their daughter, Mary Beth 
Mellon, her husband, Jim 
and daughter. Kohl, who live 
m Canyon.

Repr. Heatly 
To  Speak Here

State Representative W  A  
< Bilik Heatly will be guest 
speaker for the March meet 
mg of the Knox County Re­
tired lea. hers Association, as 
a part of the program. “ Pride 
in America "

Ihe meeting datr has been 
changed from Tuesday. 
March 23. to Friday. March 
2b. and will he held at thr 
Communiiv Center at 2:30 
p.m.

RTA members have desig 
nated the March 2b meeting 
as an open meeting and 
cordially invite everyone to 
attend and hear our good 
tnc-nd and representative 
from ilie 101 wt District Mr 
Heatly will he introduced by 
Mrs lots Smith, program 
leader

Music (or the program will 
he arranged by Mrs Mary 
Vaughan

Mrs Mary Groves and 
Mrs Gladys Reed will verse 
av hostesses

The K TA  reporter added 
some interesting news to het 
report this week which she 
omitted in thr last write up

K IA  president. Virginia 
Cases, asked chapter Com 
munity Affairs chairman. 
Mari Groves, and Hicrntrn 
nial or (Vide in America'' 
chairman Mary Vaughan, to 
contact Knox County mem 
hers and find out how many 
hours of community service 
thes had given during the 
past year Twenty lour mem 
bers reported an average of 
135 hours each, representing 
tome J240 unpaid hours of 
work hy Knoa County K IA  
members for one year'

hon<w»  Hkr F e b ru a ry  went to Mr and Mrs Guy Glenn 
South Second IE ) M am  bar* of lha Knox C ity 
on the beauty of the red nendmea and thruba

Little Lmqu*
M eeting Slated

Parents i»f children he
tween the ages of nine and 17
years ol age. who are interrs
ted in getting the little
League and Junior League
baseball teams started this
year are urged lo attend a ,. . __. , ,  ,  contest chartman
meeting Monday. March 22.
II  ’  K) p m in the Communi
ty Center

Also parents of girls who 
are interested In softball 
league are also urged to be 
present amt coaches and m i 
nagrrs are needed for these 
teams

I N ile  leaguers who haven't 
turned in uniforms from last 
year need lo do so. according 
to |Khi| M rinrer Each player 
is asked lo turn in hts uniform

Weather
F I  RM NHF DH1 PLANT 
M A TE R IA LS  C E N TER  

4 Miles NW af Knas (H y
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date law Mgh
3-3 36 ■*o
34 36 70
3-5 .30 48
3 6 27 54
3-7 39 46
.3-8 40 43
39 34 64

Track Season Off With A 'B a n g '
Coach Jimmy Rogers' Knos 

Chy Greyhounds got the track 
season off to x magntficient 
Stan Saturday by taking Divi 
sion III honors at the Sweet 
water Relays.

Led by the triple win of 
senior Al Bateman, the team 
produced 111 points to take 
Its first win of the season 
Individually, Bateman scored 
35 points

I he new manager served in 
the U S Navy during W.eld 
Mar II.

According lo Mr Hamson. 
Jerrs Curd remains as assis­
tant manager and other em­
ployees include Mrs. Harri­
son l harloltr Jackson, lanny 
Cvpert. Leon Ward, and Bud 
Thompson.

Mr H it n v ir  opened hts 
grocers business in Rochester 
in |9*4 and moved to Knox 
C its in 1962. He uas been in 
his present location |ust m*rth 
of ihe Post Office since July 
13. 19-0

He began Wes Tes t oupon 
•-Clearing House in 1969 The 

firm hay continued to mush 
room and now services 10 5 
stores regularly in eight 
states Employees in the cou 
pon firm include Manager 
Billie Jean McAuley. Dana 
Mcllhanev. Linda Vasquez. 
leresa Speck. Cathy Wit 
hams, ad layout and coupons, 
and Linda Kay Large, ship 
ping department clerk who 
also assists as grocers store 
checker when needed

K C  Band To  
Compete In 
U IL  W ed.

The Knos City High School 
Band is busily preparing for 
ihe University Interscholaetic 
l eague competition to he held 
in Vernon next week

Under the direction of H u ­
bert Seale, the hand will be in 
competition on Wednesday. 
March 17 Ihe contest will he 
held al Wilbarger Memorial 
Auditorium and the K ( hand 
is scheduled lo perform al 
3:45 p.m

Other Class A hands ex 
peered to follow Knos Cits 
include Paducah. Mundav 
Archer City. Crowell, and 
Holliday

The bank was m dime on 
Tuesday. March 2 in prrpara 
non for the contest

Former KC hand director. 
Wes Hass of Graham was 
clittictan

g f i  concert music will 

include “ Ih r  w " cr *  
W id e ". "H sm n of Ptmsr 
and “ Winchester March

Concert judges will he Bih 
Woods of Seagraves. John 
Parnell of Sherman, and Lee 
South of Irving

Sighireading ludges are 
Dtck Whitten of tubhoek 
W A Anderson of Mesquiu 
and Barbara Stack of >ub 
bock

larrs Kingsley of Vernon I '

60
41

K C  Artist 
Has Solo 
Cisco Show

Melanie Whitley of Knot 
City is Artist of the Month al 
the Matter Memorial Library 
at Cisco Junior College. CJC 
Librarian Oliver Stillwell has 
announced. Mrs. Whitley is 
Ihe first out-of-town artist lo 
exhibit al the library since Ihe 
monthly art shows were be 
gun in 1974, Stillwell said.

Mrs Whitley has been 
painting since 1970 when she 
began studies with Hennetla 
Loll of Rule. Her most recent 
instructor is John Crump of 
Anvm. from whom she 
learned the oil glazing lech 
niquc

Mrs Whitley enjoys paint 
mg offbeat subjects or treat 
ing old subjects in a new 
manner Subjeci matter of 
Ihe show at Cisco is varied, 
featuring Texas landscapes 
and several of Acapulco She 
prefers large canvases and 
finds figure painting a new 
and rewarding challenge.

During the past year she 
has won art awards al shows 
in Snyder. Fastland. Vernon. 
Knox City, the J4lh annual 
Abilene Fine Artx Museum 
Show, the Gallery Fair al the 
West Texas Fair in Abilene, 
and her works were named 
Best of Show al the Haskell 
County Fair

Mrs Whitley s most recent 
award was second place at the 
annual Big Country Art 
Assoctatton-Texas Fine Arts 
Assoc tat ion Show at Cisco last 
fall The painting that won ihe 
award in the Cisco show was 
entered in the Slate TF A A  
Show in Austin, while two 
other of her entries were 
selected to go on the Circuit 
Tour of Big Country cities.

Mrs Whitley is an area 
director of the Big Country 
Art Association, and she is 
represented by Castleberry 
Galleries in Arlington

She is a native of Knox 
City, where she now livex 
with her husband, thin, and 
three children She is a secre­
tary for the Knox City Public 
Schools.

Librarian Stillwell has in­
vited Ihe general public ui 
Cisco and Ihe surrounding 
area to visit the library during 
its open hours and slew ihe 
exhibit by Mrs. Whitley The 
library is oj>en from N 00 a m 
to 5:00 p m Monday through 
Friday, and from 6 30 lo 8:30 
p m Monday through Ihurs 
day evenings

Mrs Whitley was in Cisco 
Iasi Tuesday to hang her tohi 
art show

She was accompanied by 
her sister. Donna Albus of 
Abilene

SS Representative 
Will Be Here Today

Carl Beisnrr. claims repre­
sentative from the Vernon 
Social Security office, will he 
in Knot City Thursday 
(today l.

He will be ai me Attv Hall 
between the hours of 10 00 
a.m and noon

Senior Citizens 

To Meet Friday

The Senior Citizens 42 (Tub  
will meet Friday. March 12. at 
2 p m  at the Community 
Center

Fvervone it invited to come 
and enjoy an a fir moon of fun 
and games

Bateman t  triumphs in the 
220 (23.4), the long jump 
(I9-7VS) and the 100 (10 2) 
buosted the Greyhounds over 
second place Rolan with 73‘/t

Jimmy Lynn, scored 23 
points winning the 330 Inter 
mediates, participating in thr 
•40 relay, and second in the 
high hurdles

According to Coach Rogers, 
the pleasant surprise was the 
Ireshmen and sophomores 
who competed so well this 
early in the season

Winning for KC  included 
ihe 440 relay tram of Richard- 
yon. Rye, Lynn and Bateman. 
120 High Hurdles. Lynn se­
cond and Jerry Eaton, fifth. 
100 yard dash. Bateman, first 
and Richard v>n fifth; 330 
Intermediate Hurdles. Lynn 
first and F.aton first (lost flip); 
220 Dash. Bateman first and 
Five sixth; Mile Run Marti 
ner second anil lohnvm

fourth; Mile Relay. Richard­
son. Espinosa. Rushing, and 
Reynolds, sixth; Discuss. 
Gnmsley. fifth, Long Jump. 
Bateman first and FTyc third; 
Pole Vault, Bishop second 
and Reynolds third 

This Saturday thr Hounds 
will be competing in the 
Graham Relays.

Milton Rowan 
Dies Suddenly
^  Funeral services for Milton 
Rowan of O'Brien were held 
Saturday morning at 10:00 
o'clock in the O'Brien Baptist 
Church with the Rev. Boh 
Cameron, pastor, and thr 
Krs Paul Anderson pastor of 
thr First Baptist Church in 
Knox City, officiating Bunal 
was in the Knox City Ceme­
tery with Smith Funeral 
Home tn charge of arrange­
ments

Rowan. 61. died suddenly 
Thursday at hts farm six miles 
east of O'Brien after suffering 
a heart attack

B.»rn February 16. |9|4, in 
(.lark County. Arkansas, he 
moved to Knox and Haskell 
counties with his family in 
September 1926 Milton mar 
ried Bernice Jercnc Tankers- 
ley on December 25. 1936 in 
Knox City. He was a member 
of the O'Brien School Board 
for 2> years and was Sundav 
School Superintendent for the 
O Bnen Baptist Church

Survivors include his wife, 
of the home; two vms. Jerry 
of Henrietta and Lowell of 
Denton, one daughter. Mrs 
Debt Burson of Haskell; two 
sisters. Mrs Bonnie Hackncs 
of Knox (its  and Mrs Vcrnell 
Tankersley of O'Brien, and 
three grandi hildren. Paul and 
David Rowan of Denton and 
Tree! Hurvin of Haskell.

Pallbearers were nephews 
Joe and Jim Hackney. Jimmy 
and Bobby Tankersley. and 
Donald and Sammy Tankers­
ley

Members File For 
School Board Places

Filing for places on the 
Knox County School Board 
are Jack Idol. Benjamin, 
member. County at large; 
Arlin Ktnnihrugh. Vera, 
member. Commissioner P m  
two. and J Omar Cure. 
Mundav. member, Commis 
stoner Prec. four

Election will he held for 
these school hoard trustees 
Saturday April 3. from 7:00 
a m until 7-00 p.m in the 
Memorial Building. Goree. 
(its  Hall Mundav. < ommu 
nity (enter. Knox City; 
Courthouse, Benjamin, and 
Gilliland School Building. 
Gilliland

Thr Beniamin Rural High 
School District will hold its 
election along with the elec 
lions for the City of Benjamin. 
Knos County Hospital Dis­
trict. (  ounty School Board of 
Trustee* and the North Cen­
tral Trias Municipal Water 
Authority District on Satur­
day Ajml 3. in the Knox 
County ( ourthouse

Two will be elected for 
three vear terms and both 
incumbents, louts Bats and 
loutsr Hcrtel. filed for re- 
election However. Mrs Her 
tel declined to run and thr 
name of F D Welch has been 
added in her place.

F ledum judges are Mrs 
Sue Oxford of Beniamin and 
Mrs Venta Horne of Gillt 
land

K C  JuniorsTo 
Present Plays 
Friday Night

The Knox City Junior Class 
will prevent two une-ad plays 
Friday night beginning at 
7 30 in the school auditorium

“ Adam and Eve", a free 
form adult comedy will be the 
first presentation of the even­
ing with Kells Robinson por­
traying Adam Adrian Jones 
will be playing the part of 
Eve.

The second play will be 
‘ Bench 18" a comedy in one 
act. Characters portrayed in 
this comedy will be Sammy by 
Kelly Robinson, the officer by 
Troy Lewis, a tramp by Jewell 
Culberson, a boy by Bills Bob 
Reynolds. Julia by Sheryll 
Guinn. Lady with a Buggy by 
Sherry Jackson, a girl by Judy 
Morgan, a gentleman by Jer­
ry McCown, and a blonde by 
Marylon Bun

Junior class sponsor is Me­
lanie Whitley

Everyone is urged to come 
out and enjoy this fine enter­
tainment hy the junior class. 
Admission prices will be no- 
led in a display ad elsewhere 
in this week's News.

Bicentennial 
Plans Made

The Knox City Bicentennial 
Commission met in the Com­
munity Center Tuesday. 
March 2. to consider and 
formulate plans for the re 
mundcr of this histone year 
of celebrating the nation s 
200th birthday

Along with the three com 
mtttee chairmen. general 
chairman Mrs. Kenneth 
Crownover. Horizons chair 
man J B Tabor, and Festival
chairman Mrs Jeff Graham, 
some 25 interested members 
and citizens were present 
including Mrs Faye Rails 
hack, city secretary Heritage 
.hatrman Mrs Mary Vaughan 
was unable to attend due to 
illness. . .

Pastors and choir leaders ol 
the participating churches are 
beginning plans for • 
community wide production 
to be presented probably on 
the night of July 4th. 1976.

Rev Paul Anderson, 
pastor of <hr First Baptist 
Church, the Res James Pat 
terson. past'”  ,hf 
United Methodist Church, the 
Rev W R Shiflett. pastor of 
the Foursquare Church, and 
Mrs Dottie l-owrey. musk 
director and organist for Firxt 
Methodist were present to 
begin plans and arrange 
ments

Supt W R  Baker was 
elected chairman of thr July 
4th celebration which m 
eludes a community picnic 
dinner, games, races, and a 
full afternoon of celebration 
and fun

Partkitating tn events will 
be various organizations and
groups from Knox City and 
surrounding territory

Immediate plans according 
to Mrs Crownover. must be 
i-entered on the Good Fndav 
celebration in Knos City when 
the Bicentennial Armed For- 
ces Caravan will •"•**■* 
official appearance from 1 00
to 6 00 p.m. ,__

Plans are underway to have 
•n at show, musk bv the KC

See PLANS Pg. 3

Did You Know
that Charles Burton. Box 

821. Truscott, Texas Sub­
scribes to The Knox County 
Newx?
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Du vou need to save !!!? 
S TATE F A IM  AUTO 
INSURANCE IS*.

••••••
S TATE EARM  Home Owners
20%,

M M ..

6%  Interest on new car 
financing including SERVICE 
LIFE for icrm of loan

•••••to
LIFE INSt lA.NCE with l).ci
drnds up lo ’S A  b> the 2Jrd
year.

••••••
LEO FETSCH IASI I  LACE

422 42Su m Muted.' 10-23 tfc

SEE YOCR M O A l Mf ATS
before vou buy More than SO 
design, lo choose from Also 
curb work J.C. Mc<jee 
10-21 tfc

KELLY DtTCHINC SERVICE
24". 12'*, 6”  ditch
Plastic pipe, fittings Sever 
pipe Phone 4|S 77J-34J4 
Boa Jffc. Stamford. T r u e  
4-3 4tp S-l tfc

I need listings on all binds of 
homes and land in  i where 
Wallace Mean-house Mun 
das. Texas Maine 8 17 
422 4342 I 24 cow

FROM W A ll TO WALL, no
soil at all. on carpets cleaned 
with Blue lustre Rent elec­
tric shampooer I I  Pern s 
Knox Cits 3-11 Itc

FOR SALE -14*3 Tosora 
Corolla If interested, call 
hMF34l2 after 4 p m  Wayne 
McKinney 3-11 >tp

WHILE THEY LAST 23
Channel. 13 862B Midland 
CB Radios. $4y 00 and 
I t h'OB Midland Base l  nits 
l l '2  SO Also nos. in stock 
Turner Super Sick-kicks Road 
King A) s and Stardusler 
Antennas Rodds CB's. nett 
dian to Rodds s Car Wish. 
KnoiCns E l l  Itc

ADDING M ACH IAF rent*,
Bails Mont his rates BDH S 
S I PF R SAVE I I tfc

PLttW DIM S, Chisel Sweeps 
ind Sptkrs Sen is Shredder 
Parts Bearings tor all makes 
Few belts FGFNBAC HER 
IM P! nGc 1242 8-21 tfc

HtlMF W i i RKFRS needed m
this area to lace leather goods 
at home Earn SIsO per week 
A.I experience nevessars 
Send SI DO (refundable| and 
lung stamped envelope to 
Cumberland Leather Craft. 
ISIh Mags View Dr Kings 
port, Tennessee CnnO
3-11 3tp

FOR SALE -Two Inn on South 
Fourth West Call 8M -J 840 
3-4 tfc

CARPETS A FRIGHT* Mak.
'hem a beautiful sight with 
Blur Lustre Rem elect rs, 
shampiaurr. $1 Clly Hard 
•are 3-11 lit

BAYLOR M ILLING CO.
Throckmorton Highs as Ses 
nsour Custom Mixing Pel­
leting Your grain or sirs 
Range cubes, creep teeda. 
hog teeds, start to finish 
NM.-W2I 10-10 tfc

N E E D E D -L V N  lor relief 
sfufc. 7 io 3 and 3 to I I -  
Contact admuiislriior 817 
422-4MI leisure Lodge. 
Mundas 3-4 2tc

W ATER W ELL D il l  LING
im giiton and domestk also 
lest pumping Call W P 
Hise Haskell |817) V»4 J ? 7 .
18 tfc

PUBLIC NOTICES
BECAUSE THE PEOPLE M U S T K N O W ,

THREE BEDROOM HOLSE
K>r sale on comer lot. SOI 
South Third See Allen Hester 
or phone bS8-3'43 or 
8S8JI44 10-lb tfc

I W ill  NOT BF responsible
for ans debts incurred by any 
person, other than msseH. 
Diane Newsom 3-4 2tp

FARM  A R A M  H W ILD IN G .
portable si elder Building 
pipe for sale, different sues. 
Will build pens and barns. 
Call Homer Rolslon 81" 4S4- 
.1341 Beniamin l-lbtfc

F'OR SALE: House 5 Mims
and batb. and Trailer Park 
with double bath house, on 
lots H  14 I* B -C l M 
Original Survey Cits of Knui 
CMS Phone ' NObi ">» 8102 or 
7B5-18B7. Lubbock. Tcias 
4-11 tfc

FUR SALE Ten eves and 
three baby lambs J O 
W arren AW 3H>4 3 4 2tc

IE Y O l N EED  FERTILIZEB.
see Herbert Be'lingbausen or 
call 8SA 381 " 12  18 tfc

PI MPV-lrng*!:.-«i Domes 
tv Formanon testing WeH 
Drilling We pull and repair
ait type pumps Rea Pump 
C>>mpari. Throe kmortou 
Higbvas. Haskell Tex. Call 
24 hours 81** 8M  33'?.
10-4 tfc

I'm ' P tY M O L T H  F I RY III
less than 40 000 miles Auto 
math irancmisMoa and air
conditioner Real clean on 
inside, couple of dents on 
outside VoO oo Call fcdl 
3230 dass 3-11 2tc

FOR SALE |4h3 Impala 
Chess 4 dive. V -8 , Air Con- 
dttnsner Healer Radio. New 
tor's Good nditlon Mrs 
C H Keck bsh-LMn 
3-11 2tc

CARD OF TH AN K S
We mould tike lo express 

•ur vine err thanks tv every 
one for ihe mans acts at 
consolation extended .luring 
ihe death I -v r  sister Mabel 
Franklm

3-11 Ik

Getxgia Keck 
Fay Lunday

* »  have 'ncuivnd a nww sbipmnoi 0f malarial
P ’V E  U S A  T B Y  - A LL  W O R K  G U A R A N T E E D

CHARLIE’S 
UPHOLSTERY
Shop Phone Horn# Phone
M0-2B07 VER A . TE X A S  8BB-3144

b»WfeBI MfU.yil ll|lW4JWî WB^ j ijgjjtll|WUUJuJUc-ae.vW ^ A W < W u

B EAD S . RINGS - B EAD S RINGS BEAO S

Oz

o
<
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Mad About 
Macrame

Plant Hangers 
Necklaces - Belts 

Wall Hangers

N O TICE OF
CITY OFFICERS ELECTIO N  

O s  af k a a i O s
Nonce is herebs given that 

a Cny Officers' Elect am suit 
be held on the 3rd day of 
April |4't> in the a b « r  
named cits for ihe purpose f  
rleciing ihe Mfawm g .sffierre 
lor vaul cits I Aldermen 
Said election mil be held at 
the foikming pilling places in 
said ctlv L nmmuntts Center. 
212 S Hurd St (E l

Ihe p ills  at each of the 
abuse .U signaled pitting 
places shall on said etretum 
das be open from ” 00 o'clock 
a m in ' 00 o'clock p m 

The ihveniee soling for (hr 
a hose >lc signaled election 

.shall he held at C uy Hall 
* Building, in said city, and 

van! placv of abscnlce sotirg 
shall remain open he at leas' 
h hours cm each das of 
absentee soling which is n o  a 
Vuurdas. Sundas or an ofti 
cial Si aic holidas. beginning 
o*i ihe 20ih das and com mu 
mg ihrough the 4th das 
preceding ihe dale of said 
election Said place of viXing 
shall re main o p  n between 

k s s rs  of h till o'clsnk a m
and i  (X) i i 'e ie i  p m

Ua'cel this the full das eg 
Starch |4*ti

s K K nneih Cnm nost r 
M j s o *

m i i k  f m  
(  ITY O FFICER S’ ELE C TIO N  

O ’ Brien
S o e r  is herebs given that 

a Cus Officers Election will 
be held on the 3 das of April 
|4'h m ihe abuse named ctls 
he the purpose <4 electing the 
Is'liens mg .iffiscrs for said .ns
2 Aldermen Said election will 
be held at the following 
p  iling places in said cut 
O Brsen (  .u p  Gin Office 
Budding

The polls at each of ihe 
above designated pilling 
places shall on said eleciusn 
das be -pen from 7 o'clock 
am  lo o'clock p m

The absentee voting he the 
abuse designated election 
shall be held at O'Brien Coop 
Gin Building in said city, and 
said place of absentee sotmg 
shall remain open for at least 
8 hours on each das of 
absentee soling which is not a 
Saiurdas. Sundas or an offi 
ctai Stale holiday, beginning 
on the 20th das and continung 
through the 4th das preceding 
ihe dale of said election Said 
place ot voting shall remain 
open between the hours of 8 
o'clock a.m and 5 o'clock 
p m.

Dated this the 2 das of 
March. I>m

s F 0  Fmcrvm  
Masor

LEGA1 N O TICE
Notice is hereby given bs 

ihe Parks and Wildlife De 
pan mem that a public hear 
mg will be held at 10 a m on 
March 22. I478 g  ,hc County 
Courthouse at Benjamin for 
the purp.se of gathering in 
for mat ton (oncermng peo- 
p>*ed hunting, fishing and 
napping regulations for Knot 
County

As the result of action by 
the fexas legislature the 
Trias Parks and Wildlife 
Commissam is responsible for 
'he setting of seasons, bag 
Kmats and means and me 
thuds of taking the wildlife 
reuurces m Knox County AH 
w>(-rested persons are urged 
*o alirnd and comment upon 
»ht proposed rrgulations.
3 II fir

AY ISO DE FI E l l  ION DE 
F I M  ION A RIOS DE 

LA C1l DAD 
(  ludnd dr Knox Cky

Se da aviso p e  la presrnte
i|ik- se lies ark a cabo una 
Flee ciBn dr Funckuianos dr 
la (  tudad el df. I dr Abnl. de
14'b, en la . itidad a t m i  
mctHionada para el proposin' 
dr clrgtr a kss siguirnlcs 
fun. text arms para dicha ciu
dad 3 Concrialea. Dec ha 
clrcc'ion se llesara a cabn rn  
los siguienlrs lugares de sofa 
cun en die ha ciudad en el 
I difKio t ommunits Center. 
212 S Third St (E I

los lugares dc cu(act6n 
arnba dcsignados para dicha 
ckx c-if.n sc- manicndrfn abler 
-•v cn cl mrncionadi dfa de

clesssoncs dc las 7 uo a m a 
ias '  <X) p m

la  Soiactf'ii auscnic para la 
ck-i. An arnba d-cgnada se

- c jiA a cab>- in  el FdifKto 
(i ls  Hall, cn dkha ciudad y 
di« ho lugar dc siMac An
ausc nic sc mantcndrS abicno 
p e  lo nw-nos cwlio boras cn 
. ada <*-j  dc viuacdln auscnic 
no viendo slbjdo dommgo o 
h* li siiso ..tHial del Fsiado 

|1|in. iputido 20 dfSc s cun 
mu.usd.. liasia i l  . uarto .tfa 

ante rtcuvs a lo feefca dc dic ha 
8i lb ... lugar dc cm  a 

.4m sc manic ndra ahH-rtn dc 
lav H I I I  a m a las '  (10 p m

Fchado isla dia 8lh dc 
Vfar/o. cl. |4'fi

s K Kcnncih (  row nove'r 
Alcalde

AVISO DE FLEX CION 
DE E l N O O N  ARM S DE 

LA CIU D A D  
O'Brien

Sc da as iso p ir la prescnle 
i|ue sc llesara a cabo una 
Ellccc hm dc Fun. mnarsos dc 
la (  tudad el dia 3 dr Abril, dr 
I4"b. en la ciudad arnba 
mc-neionada para cl proptssii. 
dc dcgir a los siguienlrs 
tuncionanov para dK'ha ciu 
dad 2 (  oniejales Die ha .-lei - 
ckMi sc llesara a cabo cn los 
siguicntcs lugares dc voucton 
rn dkha ciudad: O'Brien
loop Gin Office

los lugares dc votaemn 
arnba dcsignados para dicha 
clcvcibn sc manu-ndran abler- 
los cn cl mencionado dfa de 
clccciones de las 7 a m a las 7 
p m

la  stxacktn ausenie para la 
ctcvcion arnba drsignada se 
llcsari a cabo cn el Edificw 
O  Bncn Coop Gin Office, en 
diclta i tudad. y die ho lugar de 
veHac fun ausrntr sc mamen- 
drk jbu-rto pm k> me nos <Kho 
horas cn cada dia de venae km 
auscnic no siendo sibadom 
doming., u dia frsnvo ..fkial 
del F.siado. prim ipiando 20 
dus s oxilinuando hast a el 
cuano dia anteriurra a la 
ft cha de dk ha r ln .s m  Dn ho 
lugar de sexaewsn sc mantrn- 
dra abk-no dc las 8 a m a las 
)  p n

Fes hado esia dia 8 de 
Mar/.> de I47b

s- E D Emerson 
A kaide

T H A I IN A CCO R D A N CE 
W IIH  SEC TIO N  30 0b O f  
THE PI N A L t  ODE O F T E X ­
AS (  RIMINA1 TRESPASS 
IS F N A II  B i l l  I I I  PASSED 
BY IH E  b2nd LEG ISLA- 
l l  Rf I N O TK 'F  IS HF HI BY 
( . IV IN  IH A 1 A Ll LANDS 
OF IH I  W | W A GG ON I R 
E S IA T E  ARE POSTED - 
SAV E AND EXCEPT 
W ill Rl W R ITTE N  PERMIS­
SION IS G IVEN  TO  C O M E 
UPON TH E SA M I

K IL 1 F N M  M OORE 
TR U S TE E

3 -II if.

Political
Calendar

The Knox County News «  
authorized to make Ihe fal­
lowing political announce­
ments. subject to the action of 
the Democratic Primary in 
May All pshtkal advertising 
must be paid in advance

For State Representative 
101 it Legtslatrvc District 

W .S. B i l l .  HE.ATLY
t re-election I

For District Judge 
N>h Juduial District 

R J- IJLDSONI BALI H
(re-election)

For District Attorney 
yOth Judk-tal District 

W .H . H E A T L T
(re-election)

For Sheriff. Knox County 
H .C . STO N E 
(re-election)

For Tax Asse-sxoc-CoHector 
Knox County

JO H N  A SM ITH
(re election)

For (  ommuskinet. Prey J  
Knox County

R .( D A N IEL
(re-election)

For Commissksner. Ptec I 
Kno i County

C .C . IBL DDYI ANGLE 
CH A R LES LAN K FO R D  

BILLY G E N E  JO H N STO N  

CH A R LES RAY SM ITH

For County Attorney 
Knox County

BOBBY D. B C R N ETT 
(re-election)

CARD O F TH A N K S
Wc wish to express our 

thanks and appreciation to all 
lut the mans acts of kindness 
extended lo us during the loss 
of our loved one. Your visits, 
cards, food, and the mans 
ktvely Rowers, were truly 
appreciated and especially 
the comforting words of sym 
paths and the prayers offered 
m our behalf

The Milton Rowan Family 
The Jack lankrrslev Family 

The Elwuud Hackney Family 
311 Itp

N EED  RCBBER STAMPS?
Wc ran get them for you 
fast- reasonable, too The 
Knox Counts Newt. (08  1142

faEffEr Patterns
w ith  a 

W ESTERN Flair

■'Whereunto He called vou 
by the gospel, to the obtain­
ing of the glory of our Lord 
Jesus Christ II TTtessaki 
mans 2 14

God has chosen you whom 
the Lord loves to be saved by 
the Spirit's power to make 
you God's own people, bs 
your faith in truth He rails 
you through hit Word of 
truth, he wants you to possess 
and share of the gfarv of the 
Lord Jesus Chnst In trying 
times just hold on to the 
Word, stand Firm in the 
truths of God. mhkh is the 
Bible Remember the lord is 
faithful, he wilt make you 
strong and keep you faithful 
and safe from all evil.

The spirit will reveal lo you 
the secrets in his Word that 
will help vou to keep the 
vklory We find them to be 
that wc have an ohltgatksn, 
which means a binding, legal 
agreement; wc owe a debt few 
a favor, a service, it's your 
responsibility to be faithful, to 
belicte in and fully trust the 
One who gave his life lot 
you.

You must not he lazy, 
critical. suspicious, gossip 
mg. meddling, in other peo­
ple's business Keep vour 
heart pure, full of kssc Owe 
no man anything but love, 
esteem everyone else better 
than yourself, bless them that 
curse vou. prav for them that 
dcspttefully use you. rejoice 
continually in hope. and 
Streams of Glory will flood 
your life

CAR D  OF TH A N K S
Wc will always feel 

indebted to our friends and 
neighbors for the many acts of 
kindness, prayers, bkxtd. 
phone calls, visits, cards, 
flowers, food, and the many 
donjikms to the Juds HufYin 
Hone Fund, during the recent 
iragk loss of my husband and 
mtam son

Mas God bless each of you 
Mrs Juds B o v

Mr and Mrs Bob Hamilton 
and children

J II  Itp •

Hospital 
News

PAT IF N TS DISM ISS! I)
SINt F IF  HR! ARY 24. iWo
K n o t  ( list I I Gilpin. (Mel! 
Carver. H M Farmer. Flea 
mw D rie r Irresa Speck. 
Mattie Partridge. Grads 
Benedict (deceased)
Mundasl luds Hi*u I J 
Smith (desrasedl. Ona lid 
well
Rochester Mamie Kiefei, 
thwofhy Hotlibunon. Kate 
Hell, l le s r  Hester, Sarah 
Harris
O'Brien: /ollic Ihomas

( opperas Cute, Tetaa: foils
Anderson

P A T H  M S  IN M O S M T A I 
M A R L  H  8 . 1478
Knot CMsi Lloid Rascw, lam
mk Greenwood. Jesse Gilpin 
t2nd sdmisSMNll. Bill Magee 
Mars Vaughan 
Mundas: John M i Mahon. 
Adeline Albtis Dennis Wil 
hams
Rorhrklrr: Hcrschel Rogers. 
Kaitirsn Adkins. W I Adkins 
(rtwee: Tom Harlan 
Benjamin. M ynic Piopp*

Thto|

( m \ A
P0|

n  t e  iju*
. 7®̂  _*%ton 
'*»•» via

*** V»«

t !. t

C A U  IN VO 

Midi

ODl
b u h tJ

All Work (

SELL IT FAST
with o low-cost 

Classified Ad

R EG IS TER ED
LAND

SURVEYOR

Lynn 0 . Jackson 
Ptrone 422-4968 

Box 242, Munday

Ft I-Sal Mg

k ille r i

A C C E P TIN G  S EA LED  BIDSC 

K A TH E R IN E  BIRKENFELD 

E S T A TE ,

155 aerns northwnat of cornnr ol Rhln 
non-pat tk lp a tln g  royalty ratatnad for 
R atarva  right to rajacl any or all bids 
Francis B irkanlald. Roufa 2, Mundg 
76371 B E F O R E  30th ol M a rch . 1976

When your 
water system 
lets you 
down. . .

1218

Girts Two Pise* 
Wostam Suit

L a n g  s le e v e  co a t 
w »t lh  l a p e l s  a n d  
iAfestarn yoke trim  
t o n g  fitted boll bottom  
pants w ith  yoke and 
zipper closure

Punted pattern 
*1215 m sizes 4 to 14 
Send 82 50 for this
pattern ndd 50c
handling and postage 
Send to

TH ER E'S  O N E  T H IN G  

Y O U  S H O U L D  N E V E R  

C L O W N  A R O U N D  W IT H

ond that s your savings! M oney 

should be put to work lor you —  

that s w h y it s im portant to bank 

where you get the highest earnings 

on your dollar We invite you to check 

our rates . you'll find them nothing 

lo laugh at And savings here are 

insured

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK

M EM B ER  F .D .I.C .-IN S U R E D  TO  $40,000 
KfYox City, T « x m
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He hoapttal
manager,

24, 1438 in 
Meiico. he 

t Ranch in 
1464. he 

Marta" 
The 

[ ranch 
! his wife. 
; one son. 
home, two 
and Luc-u. 
is parents, 
epcion Es- 

sti bro- 
of Monter- 
iIobki. Sa- 
[ and Luts. 
(Ke sisters, 
en Estrada 
Socorro de 
trey. Me*- 
I ana Bara 
londa. and 
os Angles 
California

cnedict

IJe rv ic e s

relatives and 
y Benedict who 

. March 5, for 
iwes included 

1 of Con­
st* Mr and 
t Krii* of Auv 
port httc\ and 
lolutd Suit of 
land Mrs Price 

11/ and

Mrs. Ba/el Glasscock of Rock* 
wall. M r. and Mrs Curtia 
Casey and Mrs. Mildred 
Glasscock of Tniscott; J B. 
Eubank of Paducah; Mra. 
Mann Tackiit of Seymour; 
Perry Tackitt of Wichita Falla; 
Mr and Mrs Hewitt Sim* 
mons and M r and Mrs. 
Ronnie Simmons, all of G illi­
land; Mrs. Bobbie Kinm- 
brugh and Meliaaa of Floy da - 
da; Rev. and Mra. Jarrell 
Sharp of Seymour; Rev. and 
Mrs Dick Richards of Ralls; 
Mrs Roy Craig of Stamford; 
Sam Angle of Slaton; M r and 
Mrs Lyle Stodghlll and Mrs. 
W R Moore, all of Munday; 
Mrs Tom Brooke Hudson of 
Benjamin, and M r. and Mrs 
Lester Patton of Crowell

Her* To Attend  

Rowan Funeral
Among the relatives and 

friends attending the funeral 
service of Milton Rowan Sa­
turday morning in O'Brien 
were Dr and Mrs. R E . 
Peeples of Hot Springs. A r ­
kansas. M r. and Mrs Wayne 
Davis of Malvern. Arkanaas. 
M r and Mrs. Joe Hackney 
and Marla of Baytown. Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Hackney. Todd 
and Islands of Dallas. Mr. 
and Mrs Don Tatikersley. 
Trey. Greg, and Michelle of 
Lubbock. M r. and Mrs Sam 
L. Tankcrslev of Stamford. 
Mr. and Mrs R.L. Humphrey 
of Abilene. Mrs. Rar East- 
land of Stamford. Dr. and 
Mrs. Calvin Janssen of Den- 
Ion. Mr. and Mrs. Elvin T .  
Mathis of Abilene. M r and 
Mrs. Pies Childress of Ozona. 
Mrs Grady Murray and Kelly 
of Plainvtew, M r and Mrs. 
C .G . Burson Jr .. M r. and 
Mrs Charles Childress, and 
M r and Mrs. Melvin Nor 
man, all of Haskell, Deb 
Wilson of Seymour. M r and 
Mrs Floyd Reed of Munday. 
Miss Gail Rowan of Lubbock. 
Mrs. Charles Thorn and chil­
dren. Doyle and Molly Davis. 
George Ann Davis. Gary and 
Maria Miller. Howard and 
Janice Beeler, all of Henri­
etta.

R E A D  T H E  

C L A S S IF IE D S

)x C i t y  J u n io r  C la s s
will present 

TWO ONE-ACT PLAYS

"Adam and Eva”
free form of adult comedy) 

and
“ Bench 18”
( a comedy)

IDAY NIGHT-7:30 O ’C LO C K  

School Auditorium

Admission
00 Adults .50 Students

Come and enjoy an 
Trig of good entertainment!
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m
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Free Lunches Available 
To Certain Students

The Knot City Schoul Is 
now serving nutritious meals 
to students every school day 
for 45 cents (grades K-4) or SO 
cent* (grades 5!2>. breakfast 
fivr 20 cents and eitra milk for 
10 cents, according to Bill 
Hokomb. principal.

However, children from 
families whose income is at or 
below level* shown on the 
scale below arc eligible for 
free or reduced-pnce meal* 
If the children ate eligible for 
free meala they are also 
eligible for free estrs milk 
The reduced pri*-w for orrak 
fast ts 5 cents snd for lunch 10 
cents. It a family'* income it 
greater than those shown, but 
the family hat unusually high 
medical bills, shelter costs in 
access of 30 per cent of its 
income, special education es 
pentev due to the mental or 
physical londmon of a child, 
or disaster or casualty losses 
their children may atill be 
eligible

The school children of pa 
rents or guardians who be­
come unemployed are eligible 
for free or reduced-price 
meals and free milk during 
the period of unemployment, 
provided that the loss of 
income causes the family 
income during the period of 
unemployment to be at or 
below the levels shown on the 
scale

Applications have been fur­
nished the atudentt and fami­
lies may apply at any time 
during the year for the free 
meala and free milk or 
reduced-price meals by com­
pleting the application and 
returning it to the school. 
Within ten days after receiv­
ing the completed applica­
tion, the school will lei the 
families know whether or not 
their children are eligible If 
there are those who do not 
»gree with the school's deci­
sion they have the nght to a 
(air hearing. This can be done 
by calling or writing W R 
Baker, superintendent at 
Knot City School, telephone 
658-3521

In certain cases foster 
children are also eligible for 
these benefits For those who 
have foster children living 
»Hh them and wish to apply 
for such meals and milk for 
them, they are atked to notify 
the school or indicate sue h on 
the application.

All children are treated the 
same regardless of ability to 
pay. In the operation of child 
feeding programs, no child 
will be discriminated against 
because of race. sei. color or 
national origin.

If we can be of anv further 
assistance or if a family site 
or income changes during the 
year please contact the 
school.

FREE AND R E D U C E D  ELIGIBILITY IN CO M E SCALE 
Family Annual Income

Family Sue Free Meals Reduced-Price Meals

1 *0-3.230 *3.230 5.040
2 0-4.240 4 240 b 620
J 0-5.250 5.250 8 200
4 0-6,200 0.260 4.770
5 0-7.140 7,140 11.210
b 0-8.110 8.110-12.650
7 0-8.450 8.450--I3.470
8 0-4. "NO 4.740 15.280
4 0 -10.550 10.550--16.460
10 0-11.310 11.310-17.640
II 0-12.000 12.060 18.820
12 0-12.810 12.810- 20.000

iUch Additional 
Family Member

*750 *1.180

King County 
History To Be 
Available Mar. 13

G l/ 'T H K IK — T h e  volum inous hicentrnniul edition of 
" K in g  C o u n ty— W indm ill* and Harbed W ire " w ill be 
made public for the first time Saturday, M arch l.i , w ith 
an announcement party at the K ing County C o u rt­
house in  G uthrie.

fhe  47B-pagr h istory book, one of the largest county 
histones published in recent years, has been i <implied 
and edited by the K in g  County llis lo ru u l Society and 
published by Norte* Press ol Ifusnsh, one of the 
Southw est's moat prolific publishers of I csss t ounty 
Histories.

T h e  announcement party w ill be (rom  lit a m. until 
noon under the direction of the Historical Society. 
Mra. Peggy W alker, president of the group, said that 
hook* w ill he available for those who have reserved 
copies w hile  orders for addilnsnal hooka w ill be ta­
ken.

Use book is published in a hardhai k edition, eight by 
ten and a half inches and contains the most complete 
history of King C o u n ty , its ranches and pioneer farm- 
lies ever published

K in g  ( ounty was officially eaiabli»h«d in IHWI and 
today rem ains much the same as it w n » in the late IHth 
century w ith  most pioneer ranches still occupying the 
ro lling  plains and brakra

l arge ranches such as the Btitvti, P iU h fo rk , Master- 
son, Hwenson. Hoas and others still <omjx.se much of 
the county w ith farm ing, m ainly in the northern  part, 
adding to King County's economy.

Ih e  history opens w ith  a chapter on the o rg a n isa ­
tion o f  K ing ( ounty. Including early day census and 
other courthouse records along with stories of hang 
ings and gunflghts in the county scat of G uthrie

tH h e r chapters include the historic ra m h e s, a torn 
plrte and aulhorative hiatory of cdu»alion in K ing 
t o u n ty, the county'* churches snd < om m uniliea, many 
of them no longer in ra ia lente . snd a collection of 
legends, yarns and aloriea about King ( ounty.

Well over 2(NI pioneer family histories are included 
w ith  individual hlaloriea provided by the families 
themselves and adding considerably to the early dav 
hiatory of the county. M ore than mm photographs are 
included In the h isto ry, the vasi majority of them 
never before published and many having unusual his­
toric significance

Members of ihe K in g  < oanly H islorn al Buciety m - 
riude Mrs W alker, president. M r- M .ld n d  IM Iia rd . 
Mra. MyMI Hensley. Mra. Ila rle n r Gibson. Mrs. Ann.-ll 
Sm ith. Mr*. Bernice Worvds and Mrs Hoyts* Master- 
son. Mrs. V iola M orris provided a largi numbs-r of 
sketches for ihe hook w h ile  la illir  I r t m e s  Gibson, a 
long-tim e King < ottle County s< h<x»l lea* her. gave Ihe
publisher permission to in* lud< her unpuhlish.-d
thesis, "H ia to ry  of Education in King * ounty as a
chapter in  the b«sok .

Mra. W alker r  tpressed her appre* ial***n and that ol 
the committee for the help and cooprnation of all Ihe 
people of K in g  (  ounty and former r e s id e n t s  of th e  

county In gathering m aterial for th. bo**
" K in g  C o u n ty — W indm ill* and Barbed Wire is 

her t o  in a aertea of Tesaa (  aunts Histories published 
by Norte* I ’ reea. Am ong other count* h tato fteacarry- 
m g the Nortea im print are Hardem an, ►••ard. B a ilo r, 
t hi (dress Haskell. Ikonley. (  o llln . In h a lle . W ise Har 
u s e r. Lee. IHckena. Potter. Htephens. M idley. Waah 
m gton. and W ilbarger

P L A N S  
Prom Page One

Jamboree Band and perhaps
ihe Knoi City High Schoul 
Band, a square dance eshlbt 
lion, a lemonade stand, and 
who knows what else will 
develop, Mrs Graham ea- 
claimed

Anv group that would like 
to participate in ibis unique 
celebration should call Mr*. 
Crownover at the Chamber of
Commerce office, 658-3442, 
or Mrs Graham at 658-3127.’

Plans also call fur a regular 
column to appear in The Knot 
County New* to recognize 
past groups and organizations 
for contributions ol merit to 
the Bicentennial celebration, 
at well at provide a calendar 
of coming events Mrs Gra­
ham »** asked hv the group 
to sn-ange this procedure.

Mrs Graham explained 
that plans are to present 
certificates of merit for the 
many cuniributtons already 
made and recognize those 
that will be coming up

She emphasised that if any 
club or organization has a 
plan for Bicentennial obscr 
vance. to please call her in 
order that she can place these 
on the calendar

Groups already qualifying 
include Knot City Lions Club. 
Knot City Study Club, Chris­
tian Woman's Association. 
Knot City Garden Club. First 
Untied Methodic! Church Ba 
zaar National Bela Club. 
Knot County Retired Tea­
chers Association. Goodwill
c in* t K iw i i itv K iw i 
Countv Recreation Club, and 
others

C o b b  R i t e s  
H e l d  F r i d a y

Funeral service* for Mr*. 
Lillian Catherine Cobb of 
Rochester were held Friday at 
4 00 p m in the First Baptist 
Church in Rochester with the 
Rev Kathryn Byrd, Four 
square minister of Women 
and the Rev Campbell R 
Smrlser, Methodist minister 
of Rochester. officiating 
Burial was in the Rochester 
Cemetery with Smith Funeral 
Home in charge of arrange­
ments.

Mrs. Cobb. 70. died at 
10:00 p m  Wednesday in 
Hendrick Memorial Hospital 
in Abilene after a brief ill­
ness

March 11, LB'/b KNOX C O U N TY  NLiVb P A O t TH K E E

and a member of the Church
of Christ.

Survivors include a brother. 
Claude Boyles of Wichita 
Fall*; three sisters, Faye Lun- 
day and Georgia Keck of 
Knoi City and Gladys Morton 
of Ranger; and several nieces 
and nephews

Locals’ Kin 
Buried Sun.

Born December 14. 1405 in 
Franklin, le n s , she married 
John Henry Cobb in 1424.

Funeral services for Mabel 
K Franklin of Seymour, sis­
ter of Georgia Keck and Faye 
Lunday. both of Knot City 
were held Sunday at 2:00 
p m in the Seymour Church 
of Christ with Charles Mac- 
key. minister, officiating and 
Jim Bryani assisting Burial 
was in Ihe Masonic Cemetery

Mrs. Franklin, 7b. died at 
10 00 a m Friday in Wesi- 
view Manor Nursing Home in 
Seymour.

Born Mable Boyles on Au­
gust 3, 1844 in Eastland
County, she married Joe 
Iranklin August 7. 1418 in 
Seymour He died March 10. 
1467

She was a resident ol 
Bavlor County for SB years

VISIT PARENTS
Karen snd Robbie West of 

Wichita Falls visited over the 
weekend in the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs 
Johnny Helms. Jimmy and 
Diane.

They also visited with other 
relatives and friends

IN B U C K LE Y  H O M E
Visiting in the Vernon 

Buckley home over the week­
end was their grandson. 
Rusty Buckley of Teias Tech 
in Lubbock and Herchell 
Force of Wichita Falls.

Survivors include her hus­
band. Henry of Rochester, 
two von*. J W (o b b  of Fori 
Worth and J.C . of Rochester, 
sis grandchildren, whom 
Mrs Cobbresred. Mr*. Caro­
lyn Campbell of Haskell. Mrs 
Linda Mackey of Andrews. 
Jaquita Benton of Fort Worth. 
Nickev Cobh of Rochester, 
and Jackie and Jeffrey Cobb 
of Fort Worth; two brothers. 
Rudolph Miles of San Angelo 
and Columbus Miles of Abi 
lene. and four sisters. Mrs 
Bertha Beavon of Abilene. 
Miss Daisy Miles of Abilene. 
Mrs Fva Wisher of Hamlin, 
and Mrv Polly Johnson of 
Austin

:  BICENTENNIAL COINS NOV ON SALE ’
contact

* T R U S C O T T  B IC E N T E N N IA L  C O IN  C O M M I T T E E  * 
«  Truacott, Tax** a
k a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a a  »

YOU are welcome at 
First United 

Methodist Church
S U N D A Y  S C H O O L  
M O R N IN G  W O R S H IP  
S U N D A Y  E V E N IN G  S E R V IC E

10:00
11:00
8:00r IN  A P P R E C I A T I O N

lkk* stoc k in  Am eric a. 
Itu> l S. NasinRs Kom is

Words seem so inadequate when we try to express our 
humble appreciation for the many expressions of sympathy 
extended during our recent bereavement.

The presence of friends and loved ones, your prayers, 
floral offerings, memorials, cards, words of comfort, as well 
as the food prepared and served, all helped to make our 
burden easier to bear.

Also, we want to say a special thank you to Dr. R.G. 
Howell and the entire staff of the Knox County Hospital for 
the wonderful care and concern.

May God bless each of you and keep you.

The Grady Benedict Family

i

FOR THE OFFICE
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110 SEMES—fill SUSPENSION FILES
F lf io  1SIST ALL AXL f LOCKS

PUNCHODEX  

PAPER PUNCHES

FLUORESCENT LIGHTING
b y  A rt  S p ecia lty  C o m p a n y

No *444 F L l X A R M
f  matt o* »ii gootanaefc lamp* 
fipkible §trv pat m itt thud* 
adiwt»m#nt to any Ho*®** 8
to 14 two l & M I t
♦luonHcant tutxw Rutib#f 
bum pan protort any vv*rt#ce

Tuba* and Bwitn ara not 
. *t Ktad «n that* *amp%

KNOX COUNTY NEWS
Knox C ity

•&8 -S 141



P A G E  F O U R  KNOX C O U N TY  NEWS March 1 1 . 1976

TH A N K  YOU. GOD FOB 
TH E  RAIN! T h u  ram ha* 
been a life saver in more ways 
than one. The wheal farmers 
are very happy, the irnui 
sufferers are very. very, hap­
py , and the real of the people 
are just happv for the cooler 
weather and the rain Far­
mers coming in this morning 
have had a hig smile on their 
faces when they came in the 
office The ones that were 
watering wheal are very glad 
of this so they can stop 
spending that money for the 
high price fuel they were 
using
HERE AND THERE

Mrs Janoma Stephens of 
Platnvtew visited with her son 
and wife. Mr and Mrs Butch 
Stephens during the week­
end

Mr and Mrs Billy Duncan 
and daughter of Weatherford 
visited with friends and rela­
tives during the weekend in 
0  Brten and Knot Ch>

Mr and Mrs S M Man 
mng and Mr and Mrs James 
Manning and Cods visited in 
Springtown with the Derwin 
Lancaster family. the Lam  
Gibsons and the Jerry Bro­
thers family dunng the week 
end. Pearce and Cody caught 
the plane at Dallas Sunday to 
fly to Houston where they 
were going to visit with her 
relatives in Silsbee for a few 
davs (She was going to call

them when she arrived in 
Houston and she had to wait 
for them to return to Spring 
town before she could call, as 
she arrived in Houston quite a 
while before thev could drive 
back to Sprtngtown Talk 
about living fast and furious, 
this is it.)

Visiting in the home of Mr 
an Mrs. Ivan Rowan were 
their children. Wayne of Ste- 
phenville, Keith of Snyder 
and Gail of Lubbock

Mr and Mrs Pleas Chil 
dress of Ozona and Mrs 
Grady Murray and Kelly of 
Plainvtew visited in the home 
of Mr and Mrs Grads Ellis 
dunng the weekend

Mr. Ernest O'Neal has 
returned from a long visit in 
California, with his children. 
Mr and Mrs Joe Don Bar 
nard and familv and Mr and 
Mrs Buddv Williams and 
familv H r also visited in 
Lubbock with Mr and Mrs. 
Dewayne Johnston and fami­
ly-

Mr and Mrs Jem  Johns­
ton. Kerne and Sunder vi­
sited in Paint Creek Sunday 
with friends.

Craig Brothers and Shane 
Johnston were in Abilene 
Saturday doing some shop­
ping and looking

Visiting in the home of 
Mrs Bernice Rowan were her 
children. Mr and Mrs Lowell 
Rowan. Paul and David of

THRIFTY OFFICE EQUIPMENT
COM PLETE SALES & SERVICE

P.0. Box 1828 
Vernon. Texas

For local service, call 658-3142 
or leave machine at 

The Knox County News

EVERYTHING AUTOMOTIVE
Qataa Fan Bnita. Hosa. Pulleys and 
Lloht Dufy Beits for Air Conditioners 

From and Heatings Oil Filters.
Air Both Filter*

PISTON MINOS. GASKETS and 
INSERTS FOR ALL MOTORS 

Monroo Shock Abeortoors and 
Load Lovolot*

Wo el so carry a complete lino of TRACTOR 
PARTS such ae Piston* Ring* inserts 

Bearings and Gaskets

O W E N S  A U T O  S U P P LY
JIS A**. fcSA-UU

Denton. Mr end Mrs Jerry 
Rowan of Henrietta and Mr 
and Mrs Trey Burson and 
daughter of Haskell.

Mrs Charles Thorn. Paula 
and Charts of Henrietta vi­
sited with friends Saturday 
and attended the funeral of 
Milton Rowan The Thonu 
are former residents of 
O Brten where Charles we* 
superintendent of O ’Brien 
School Also attending the 
Rowan funeral were Mr and 
Mrs Els in Mathis of Abilene. 
Mr Mathis is also a former 
superintendent of O 'B n rn  
School

The following are the stu­
dents in O'Brien School thst 
made the fourth six wreek*' 
honor roil. These students 
made *W or shove on all 
subjects Twelfth Grade-Bettv 
Gutierrez and Vicki Hew in. 
Eleventh Grade -C'raig Bro­
thers. Pam Stockton and Deb­
bie Del Hierro; Tenth 
Grade Peggy Gutierrex and 
Martha Watson; Ninth 
Grade Brenda Adkisson. Jo­
nathan Godsey. Donna 
Holmes. Shane Johnston and 
David Walling. Eighth 
Grade -Nancy Adkisson. Jo­
seph Godsey and Angelis 
Reid

N A M E D  T O  T H E  A L L -D IS T R IC T  T E A M  for District 
20-B were Dovey Holmes and Vicki H ew itt, both 
senior students at Carney H igh School In O 'B rie n .

Two O'Brien Students 
Make All-District

IN W H EELER H O M E
B J Wheeler of Odessa 

spent last M«ndav and Tues 
day in the home of his 
parents Mr and Mrs F H 
Wheeler

Devey Holmes and Vkki 
Hewitt, both senior students 
si Carney High School in 
O'Brien, have been named to 
the 2b B all District team 

Desey. w n  of Mr and Mrs 
Grady Holmes was on the 
All District football tram his 
senior year and played fool 
ball in high school for two 
years He also participated in

Smith, White Take 
Chess Championships

Knot County Chess Cham 
pionship decisions were made 
here last weekend as Ben 
Smith of Knot City took lop 
honors in the senior division 
with Adam White. Knot Citv 
seventh grade student, win 
mng the junior title honor

Smith, the son of Mr and 
Mrs. Z.l. Smith, won with 
three and one half games to 
hts credit followed closely 
behind by Jim Pratt of Benja 
mm with three games 
Charles Griffith, also of Ben 
jamin. scored with two games 
and Nick Johnston of Knox 
City had one game l  A 
Covey of O'Brien rounded out 
the scoring w ith one half of a 
game

The junior division seemed 
to cause quite a hit of interest 
as a number of youth age 
students entered the competi­
tion Wuh Adam While, son 
of Mr. and Mrs Hrnrv L 
White, winning eight and one 
half games for the top posi- 
tKm. Russell Hacker look 
eight for his total Lori 
Griffith of Benjamin won se­

ven games, followed by Cvle 
Clavton with sit games and 
Dwavnc Johnson with four 
and one half games. Tr»v 
Prill, also of Benjamin, had 
four games with Greg Oliver 
and Roy Faulk hav mg three 
each to theu credit Tyke 
Meinzer scored with one 
game and Greg Covey of 
O'Brien withdrew trom the 
competition.

Locals’ K in  
Fair Director

Dr. A .C Sharp of Abilene. 
MM-ia-law of Knot Citv resi 
dents M r and Mrs Llovd 
Walitnp is director of the 
21st annual regional Science 
Fair underway now at Mc- 
Murry College

The Science Fair, which 
began Wednesday of this 
week and will conclude on 
Friday, provides an opportu­
nity for display of the stu­
dents' work to parents, tea 
chers, other students, and the

Irrigation Pipelines . . .
From Planning to Pumping

basketball for four years. In 
track, he competed in the pole 
vault and sprints.

Vicki. who was named as a 
first team forward, has served 
as a cheerleader for the 
O'Brien school as well as 
played baskelball for four 
vears She ran track for three 
sears and is also FH A  Presi­
dent. Miss Hewitt is ihe 
daughter of Mr and Mrs. Coy 
Hewitt.

Debbie Del Hierro, another 
O'Brice student, was named 
lo the honorable mention 
all district squad as a guard

Old Glory, district cham­
pions in both girls and boy* 
baskelball. headed all district 
voting among the boys and 
shared ihe distinction with 
Rule among the girls

puhlii Students in the Region 
14 F'ducalton Service Center 
area interested in science w ill 
participate.

The purpose is to stimulate 
students to take a more active 
interest in the study of 
science, to provide encou­
ragement. and to give others 
an opportunity lo see what 
they are doing in science.

Associated director is Dr. 
Robert I Mantss of the 
Region 14 Education Servlet 
Center.

Dr Sharp, who resides at 
21 G le n w o o d  Drive, is mar 
ried to the former Mary Beth 
Waldrip of Knox City and 
they are the parents of three 
children.

News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home

Carol

MBS. ED N A  EU B A N K

Bessie Bell Michaels of 
Bochester was a welcome 
visitor to her sister. Florence 
Burleson, and niece Edo Fay 
Pounds.

Mr Waldrip entertained 
Fannie Btffer of Rochester 
and Edna Worley and Juanita 
Wyatt both of Anson

Lorena Burneson of Mun- 
day was a caller on Mrs 
Williamson and Mrs Griffith 
Mrs Knot also called on 
them a* did Mrs Ben Wil 
hams

The new pipe* for the water 
system have been installed 
taking the place of the cast 
iron pipes These are much 
larger

Norman and Irene Lusk of 
Abilene and Mr and Mrs
Johnny Cagle of Lubbock 
came to visit Mrs Beaslev

Mrs Bowden of Mundav 
called on both Mrs Hill and 
Mrs King

Mrs. McKinney of Olney is 
a new resident. She was 
accompanied by two of her 
daughter*. Mrs. Clark of Ol-

Lions Give To  
Little League

In business of the lions 
Club Wednesday. March 4. 
the club voted lo donate 
i2> 00 to the Little League 
expenses

Pete Elliston. president of 
the club, announced nine new 
subscribers to the Lions Flag 
service now bringing this total 
lo h0 flag customers Next 
dale for flags to be flown will 
be April lb for the armed 
services caravan which will be 
in Knox City for a Hiccnten 
nial event.

The president also an­
nounced that Marchtl2 will he 
the date for the Lions Donui 
Sale and dial all members arc 
urged to take pan.

I ion W R Baker hi uchi 
Curley Kismget as a guest 
and then presented him lor 
membership. Aticr some dis 
cusskmi upon Lion Baker's 
qualifications, the members 
accepted Risingcr upon his 
own merits

ncy and Mrs. Willie May 
Boeck of Beeville who helped 
lo get her settled 

Mrs Griffith and Mrs Hill 
both entertained Mrs Harrell 
and Mrs White of Mundav 

Mrs Johnnie Williams of 
Benjamin visited with Mrs 
Allen Mrs Jackson and Ale 
tha Sc if res all of the home 

Mr George Tillinghast and 
his daughter Mrs Spann both 
of Houston paid a visit to 
Velma Tillinghast and Lilly 
Vannoy

Mrs Sheppard of Weather­
ford came to see her mother. 
Mr*. McKinney 

Clifford Williamson was in 
to see his mother. Mrs 
Williamson

Mrs. Griffith was pleasant 
Iv surprised with a visit from 
her niece. Mrs Roy B. Carnes 
of Plains lew She was accom­
panied by Arnell Denton. 
Mrs. Carnes sister-in-law.
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Pre-washed 
Levi’s Denim  
Jeans

to make room fc 
Butte Knit 

and Jonathan Lc

P A N T  SUITS
2 pc. -$19.9$

P A N T  SUITS
3 p c .-$22.50

S L A C K S
Sizes 8 to 18 - $6J

Pantyhose and Pantit 
with cotton crotch from | 

Bikini to Big Mama

B O U T IQ U E
Estelle Hawkins. O wner

HYDRAULIC MOVER LATERAL ROLL SYSTEM

*2-*
/

A

i f \  V

A l l  th e  c o m fo r t  o f  o k L
These Levi’s Denim Jeans and 
Jackets arr pre washed a special 
way. so they're soft, comfortable 
and faded to a mellow blue right 
from the sfart.
Choose from three styles One. a 
handsome tapered shirt jacket with 
curved-seam panels and copper 
buttons.
Two l^ v i’s classic Denim Bells, with 
traditional I^evi’s styling and a big 26" 
leg opening
And. newest of all; Levi’* European Tit 
Jeans Tailored snug m the seal and 
thighs, flaring to a wide hottom 
Try on all three You’ll feel like they re 
yours, even before you own them

P O tTA B U  ALUM INUM  SPRINKLER SYSTEMS 

MECHANICAL MOVE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

AVAILABLE IN 
5, 7. and 8 FT. W H EELS

FOR YOUR BEST BUY-SEE 
l i iti Ancle

[817 J 858-3142

Boutique
Estelle Hawkins 

Owner

t
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M r and Mra W J. Swan 

ner and children of Arlington 
spent the weekend here with 
M r and Mra. L.G . McGuire 

Khonda W r at brook went to 
Slephenvtlle with the Crowell 
High M w l  IM A  for an area 
meeting.

College aludenta home for 
the weekend were Betty Sue 
Barry from T C U  and Nancy 
loonev from Tetaa Tech, 

Mmea H P Gillespie. Ido 
ma Chownng. and E .J . Jonea 
attended the Colombian Club 
meeting in Crowell laat week.

Gueata of the Ronnie 
Stmmonv family laat weekend 
were l>avtd and Heather Nea 
von of Waco. Mclivva Home 
of Plainview. and Laura. To ­
ny, and Liva Lont.

Vivitorv of M r and Mra. 
L M Davia laat week were 
M r and Mrv Hud Davia and 
Tina of Wichita Fall* They all 
attended the Gilliland musical 
Saturday night

Mundoy Women 

Host Beto Chi

Beta Chi Chapter of Delta 
Kappa Gamma met in the 
Homrmaking Room of Mun- 
dav High School. March b. at 
2 30 p.m Munday and Goree 
members were hostesses 

Mrv. Frma Lilev of Wet- 
nert. president of the chapter, 
provided at a short buvineas 
meeting. She read the prayer 
that George Washington used 
at Valley Eorge.

The program centered 
around the theme. "W oman 
Becoming "  The Personal 
Growth and Sen ice Commit- 
tee had charge Two guesta, 
Mrs. Larry Thompson and 
Mrs. Waynton Smith of Mun- 
day reviewed Joyce Landorf* 
book. "Fragrance of Beau 
ty ."  Music, featuring a Hi 
centennial theme, was pre­
sented by the Ladies' Quartet 
from Oewre Members of this 
group are Mmea. Parnell 
Skelton. Gerald Myers, Sandv 
Lambeth, and George Cotton 
Their accompanist on the 
piano wav Mrs. Charles Ca 
sey.

Refreshments were served 
to twenty one members and 
guests. Members attending 
front Knox Ctlv were Mntcv 
Lillian Logan. Sudia Cash. 
Toy Risingcr. Hazel Long. 
Mary Jo Lankford. Evelyn 
Warren, and Grctchen Cole 
hour.

The neat meeting will be in 
the Community Center in 
Haskell on April 3, at which 
time five new members are to 
he initiated.

Read A n d  Use 
Classifieds

. . .

M ISS S H A R O N  M C C A N D L E S S  A N D  M IC H A E L  L A Y M O N  N E W T O N

...to wed May t

Couple To Exchange M a y  Vows
Dt ( harlea E McCandlew 

of College Station announces 
the engagement of his daugh 
ler Sharon, to Michael

Lay moti Newton
Newton is the son of Mr. 

and Mrs Lavmon O Newton 
of Rochester and Miss Mc-

C O N S F R V A T IO N  E S S A Y  W IN N E R S  in the
Beniamin Schools this school year are from left. 
Diane Green, first place winner, Johnny Pierce, 
second place, and Tracy Cartwright, third Essays' 
were written In the English classes under the 
supervision of Darhl Caussey The contest was 
sponsored by the Wichita Brazos Soil and Water 
Conservation District

Girl Scout Week 
Now Underway In KC
W IC H ITA  FALLS You might 
not know it. but you belong to 
the Girl Scouts Yes. you!

If you think Scouting 
touc hes only the lives of those 
daughteres in Girl Scouting, 
think again.

Girl Scouts of the U S A is 
the largest voluntary organi­
zation for girls in the world It 
has more than three million 
girl and adult members 
linked worldwide with girls 
and women in 'H other coun­
tries through membership in 
the World Association of Girl 
Guides and Girl Scouts

Of course thev touch your 
life!

If vou think it's great that.

4 -H 'e rs  To Compete 
In District Food Show

Four Knot County youth 
will demonstrate skills and 
knowledge in foods and nutrt- 
non against those of youth 
from 21 area counties when 
they vie for honors in the 
District 4 H Food Show 
March 13. in Wichita Falls 

Competing in four food 
entry classes will be Pam 
Hutchens of Goree. main 
dishes Kim Coker of Benia 
min. side dishes; Selina Hud 
son of Beniamin, breads and 
dessert*, and Beverly Tolton 
of Beniamin, snacks and he

They earned the right to 
compete at the district level 
when they took first place 
honors in the Knot Countv

4 H Food Show held in Fe 
bruarv

For the main dish class. 
Miss Hutchens prepared 
"Chuck Wagon Beans" For 
side dishes. Miss Coker 
created Congealed Orange 
Salad"

Miss Hudson will enter 
"pineapple and Coconut Pie 
in the breads and desserts 
class, and M iw  Tolson will 
compete wrth "< hoculale 
Sheet Cake" in the snack* 
and beverages class

County and district 4 H  
loud shows are sponsored by 
the Tesas Agricultural Eaten 
vton Service, the Icias A A M  
University System, and the 
Murriaon Milling C ompanv

in this dav and age. young 
people can have fun. sonic 
where to go. constructive 
things to do. and interesting 
things to learn.-you belong

II your business, service 
dub. union synagogue, or 
church sponsors a Girl Scout 
troop. provides meeting 
places or camperships. or 
otherwise gives time, effort, 
or financial aid to the Girl 
Scouts in your commumtv vou 
belong

If you've ever bought 
cookies from a girl in green 
just because you liked her 
earnest, young face-you be­
long

If you arc a leader or 
committee member, or a so 
lunteer in any capacity even 
if vou're just one of the mans 
w ho help build shelters, teat h 
a first aid course, or drive a 
station wagon load of e u ’tled. 
giggling teenagers lo camp 
you belong

If you care about the air. 
water, and earth, and applaud 
the Girl Scouts' inmative in 
such projects as cleaning up 
our rivers, planting flowers 
and trees, and helping beauti­
fy the Knos C ity commumtv 
you belong

And vou belong if. during 
Girl Scout Week, vou enwu 
rage Girl Scouting in any 
wav even by just under Kami 
mg how much it means io the 
Scouts themselves to belong

So celebrate Girl Scout 
week with uv March 7 March 
|1 because YOU BELON G !'

BENJAMIN NEWS
by Mr* Van Graan

NN**w«aa>NiiHB«iiiM>ofiiiniorfiflBfirijttaBtfeBaaBMttgBaaaaB<

C andlcss is also the daughter 
of the late Mrs. Joyce Mc- 
< andlcss

I he couple plan to es- 
sLange marriage cows May I 
m All Faith Chapel on the 
Tcsav W M  University Cam 
pus in College Station

KC Garden Club 

Meets Tuesday
Memhers of the Knot City 

Garden Club enjoyed a pro­
gram on "Wildflowc-rs of 
Tesas”  at their program 
Tu sday at the Community 
Center.

Mrs J .C  McGee spoke on 
the many varieties of wild- 
flowers in the l<val area She 
showed pictures of flowers 
found in Knos. Stonewall, 
an.t King Coumie*. Pictures 
show n were made by Kav 
Plummer of Knos City

Another speaker. Mrs Ho- 
race Ftnlev. talked to the 
gr,>up on the more than S.ODU 
vpc. lev of w ild flowers to be 
tound in Texas, more than 
am other Slate in the Union 

1 exas elevations range 
from sea level to craggv peaks 
ol mountains mote than a 
mile high Ramtall ranges 
from more than 50 inches in 
regions of Last Tesas to less 
than eight inches m the 
Desert ol West Trsav

Flowers of even kind and 
color appear in these Texas 
settings

Flower seeds arc scattered 
by birds and winds, also, by 
the Trta* Highway IVpart 
mem who seeds the lawn type 
grasses and flowers. The 
Department is Ihc nation's 
largest "landscape garden 
c r " . with more than 800.000 
acres ol highwas right -of way 
to cultivate, mow, and care 
lor.

Arrangements in shades of 
green were prrscnlcd hs Mrs 
Clara Smith and Mts McGee 

Hostesses were Mrs. H I  
Wall and Mrs Claud Reed 

Next meeting for the club 
will he on April 13

Very criap bacon may be eat 
• n w ith  the finger*, say 
etiquette experts, but bacon 
with any vestige of fat must 
i>e cut with fork or knife and 
eaten with the fork

C E LE B R A TE  BIRTH D AY
It's son of unusual for a 

couple to have the same 
htnhday but M r and Mrs P
H Pierce do have Sunday 
March 7 was their binhdavs 
and they were honored by 
their family and friends Pre 
tent to help them celebrate 
were Mrs Sally Pierce. Mrs. 
Edna Lou Hayes, Reba and 
Regina of Fon Worth, Mr 
and Mrs. H.O. Pierce, and 
Mrs Mary C romwell. Bridge 
port Mr and Mr*. Frank 
Pierie. tony. Rod. Kent. Pal. 
David, and Terry of Stamford 
Mr and Mrs Jimmy McNul 
fy. Tracv. Charlie, and Andv 
of Hobbs New Meaico Mr 
and Mrv Hammons Pierce Jr. 
and Jennifer of Lubbock. Mr 
'and Mrs. Doyle Walker. 
Marly and Jody of Mi Adoo 
and Mrs. Mary Lou Foshee. 
Mrs Kate James and Mrs 
Dora Jean James of Knox 
City
D E F E A TE D  IN
M  DIM  K i n

The Benjamin Mustangs.
winner of District 77 B. met 
the Megargal Mustangs, win 
ner of their district in the 
bi district playoff last Tues 
das night at Munday. The 
Megargal team won by an 
overwhelming score of bO 38 
Kenny Groves scored IS 
points. Keith Conner 12. 
Keith Pierce and Ricky Carver 
four each. Johnny Pierce two. 
and Mark Collins one This 
ended a very successful sea 
son for the team and we arc 
very proud of them for a job 
well done!
HERE N TH ER F

•fr and Mrs Bill Hamil­
ton and Gary Hamilton visited 
the R l> Hamilton* in Vernon 
last week.

Mt and Mrs Clarance Hall 
of Plainview visited his 
mother Mrs. Lora Hall and 
his brother and family, the 
Hester Halls the first of last 
week *

Res K E. Woolley and 
Mark Woolley were in Hous 
ton last week to he with their 
son and brother. Tom Brews 
ter. who underwent surgery- 
Tltursdav. They report the 
surgers successful and Tom is 
holding his own at this time.

Shane and David Milson of 
Tech and Kathy Woolley of 
Spur spent the weekend with 
their parents, the S.L Mil- 
son* and Kelts

Deanii Young of Wichita 
f alls spent the weekend with 
her parents. the Dutch 
Youngs.

Mr and Mrs Ned Jones 
and sons of Javton visited her 
parents, the Butih McCanlic* 
and Dicky over the weekend

Mr and Mrs Don Roberts 
of Azle spenl the weekend 
with his parents, the Kenneth 
Roberts and her parents at 
O'Brien.

Mr and Mrs Sam Loper of 
Lubbock spent the weekend 
with his mother Mrs Lela 
Loper and his sister. Mrs 
Claude Stockton and Mt 
Stockton and other relative-

Bryan Bumpas of VRJC 
visited friends here over the 
weekend.

Mi and Mrv Bud Conner

‘VLarcn n ,  lWio K N U a c u o N I Y  istwt> PAGE. E 'lV E

Curd-Homstod 
Engagement Told

Mr and Mrs. W P Curd
Jr. proudly announce the 
engagement of their daugh 
ler. Debbie Jean, to Dean 
Warren Homstad. son ol Mr. 
an Mrs Howard Homstad of 
Hallock. Minnesota.

Tile April lb wedding will 
lake place in the home of the 
Derrell Marions, and Derrell 
will perform the ceremony.

Debbie i* a junior in Knox 
City High School and t* 
employed by the Dairy Queen 
in Knox City.

Homstad, a 1973 graduate 
of Hallock High School, i* 
employed by the City of Knox 
City.

The couple will reside in 
Knox City.

FROM POST
Mr and Mrs. Dan Zeigter. 

Bradley and Andy of Poat 
visited here the early part of 
the week with her parents. 
Mr and Mrs Wayne McKin- 
ney and her grandmother. 
Mrs. Martha McKinney, a 
resident of the Brazos Valley 
Care Home

Briggs & Stratton

0
♦

B r i d g e  A n d  C a n a a t a  f l

T o u r n a m e n t

FRIDAY. M ARCH 19. 6:00 P.M.
E N T R Y  D E A D L IN E  M A R C H  17

Efitry $2.00 per person
To enter phone 

656-6332 |D#y»|
656-3322 |*fter 5)

Sponsored By f

Ladies Assn, ot the *

Knox City Country Club il

^  Nought the
*“■« Lake 

*  '«• D o .',

r?"« **»*e
O urch 

Nought a 
^  from

A N N O U N C IN G  T H E  OPENING

M e r c k  I S ,  1 * 7 6
at

€ 1  D i s c o u n t  C e n t e r
Pace-Royal-Gemtronics 
Xtal-Midland-Johnaon 

Hy-Gam-Pearce Sim peon 
The Beet Savings In the 

Big Country
E X A M P LE  23 C H A N N EL M ID LA N D  

Only $99.96
204 t  Hamilton \ tarn lord, Tg

i #  ^  r  r  m  e  # ' i

You are invited to an Announce­

ment Party Saturday, March 13f 

10 a.m. to 12 Noon, King County 

Courthouse, (iuthrie, For The 

New King County History
6l7.:tA  (in. lulling t a il  Add 7A« for whipping i h .r g

O rder sour ropy tod**

and Kim and Mr. and Mrs. 
Keith Conner and Stephanie 
visited relatives in Lubbock
Sunday.

Mrs. Henrs Duke and Mrs 
Lee Snailum visited the Floyd 
Nunleys in Amarillo over the 
weekend and attended the 
Lawrence Welk show . 
Lnroute home on Sunday, 
they visited the Bob Pyatts in 
Plainview

Mr and Mrs Randy Snai 
lum and Casey of Garland 
vlsilcd the Lee Snailum* Sun­
day.

EN TER S HOSPITAL
Mrs. Don Hcrtel entered 

ihs Methodist Hospital in 
Dallas Sunday afternoon She 
will undergo tests Mondas 
and is due to have surgery 
Tuesday. Her room number is 
>47 and I'm sure would 
appreciate a card from any­
one. She should be hospita­
lized from a week lo ten days.

SOROSIS CLU B M EETS
The Benjam-p Sprosis club 

met Thursday in tbr dub 
room with 13 members pre­
sent Special guests were 
Bern* White of Abilene and 
Riley Dorm a who conducted a 
revival at the First Christian 
Church last week

Guest speaker was Edward 
Lee Kirk, Benjamin native 
son. now professor of govern 
nient and history at ACC who 
spoke on the constitution A

'As*?

table divutaionround 
loll..wed

Refreshments were served 
bv the social committee

IN POE H O M E
Those spending Sunday in 

the home of Mr and Mrs 
Gather Poe were Mr. and 
Mrs Oscar Johnson. Bro and 
Mrs Bob Cameron and Beth. 
Mr and Mrs Clifton Duncan, 
all ol O'Brien. Mr and Mrs 
Billy Duncan and Patti Ma- 
honev of Weatherford. Mrs. 
Bonnie Bruce. Rhondt and 
Ronnie of Munday. and Mr* 
W I Duncan of Knox City.

ENGINE
TUNE-UP

A u T M o a ia a o  
w a w v i e a  g i n t i i

We provide original parts 
tactory trained m echanic! 
and method* to Seep your 
Briggs * Stratton engine in 
top operating condition

C ITY  HARDW ARE
Kno* City 666-3222

C A R P E T  S A LE
Rag 13 00 now

7.95
P A D  6  IN S T A L L A T IO N  IN C L U D E D  
2 0 %  O F F  O N  A LL O T H E R  C A R P E T

f'^GATlON
S U P P L I E S

H E S TE R  IR R IG A TIO N
East Main A L T O N  H E S T E R

A FRANCES DENNEY 
COMPLEXION IS 
WORTH EVERYTHING!
Now, discover il 
for only 7.50
N o  matter what you are using 
n o w . y o u ’ll actually vee an 
im provem ent with Frances 
D enney superb skin care 
N o w , you can get a Treatm ent 
Introducto ry Kit w o rth  26 
♦or only 7 SO. (N o  other 
purchase necessary.) C o m e  for 
your personal skin analysis and 
these 6 un iqu e ly effective 
treatments for norm al to d ry skin.

1. Cream y Cleansing lo tio n . 2 oz.
2. M ild  Skin Lotion , 2 oz.
3 Form ula A B C  N orm alizing 

lo tio n , 4 oz
4 U n d e r M a k e u p  Protein 

M oisturizer, Vi o z.
5 N e w  Life R einforcing C re a m ,

Vi oz.
b Viva Super Masque. Vi oz.

.a* JONES 
PHARMACY me.

PHONE b46-U  IS
K I M .  t O l V IY  ItlMTtlKV 

I M l Hu* 14*4*7
Guthrie. l«-*>«» M M
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Note Book 
FILLER PAPER
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COFFEEMAT
Pound C an

BAMA

CRISCO
OILCASSEROLE BRAND

SUGAR FREE

SPAM
LUNCHEON MEAT PLASTIC JUG

JETTON S BATHROOM

Sd Tissue
White Swan NICE 'N SOFT # T »

OLEO 49«r Center CutjCHUCK ROAST
H O R M EL

TOMATOES

WHITE

Found

GREEN

CABBAGE
DELICIOUS

APPLESw
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»iH hr pre 
Kelly Robin- 
Adam and 

ting the part 
i comedy in 

e presented 
wing pco- 
■ying the

parts Sammy will be played 
by Kelly Robinaon, The Offi­
cer by Troy Lewis, a Tramp by 
Jewel Culberson, a Boy by 
Billy Bob Reynolds. Julia by 
Sheryll Guinn. Lady with a 
Hugiiv by Sherry Jackson. a 
Girl by Judy Morgan, a 
(ientlrman by Jerry McCown, 
and a Blonde by Marylon 
Hurt Now if that isn't a fine 
list of actors. I don't know 
what is Plan now to attnedl

FR ES H M A N  CLASS N EW S  
by Terry Card

The only freshman on the 
Varsity track team is Jimmy 
Rushing Jimmy runs the 
quarter and did well at Sweet 
water.

In English, we are taking 
two days a week to work on 
UIL events. Jan Low rev and 
Cynthia Rhodes are working 
on poetry Davy Counts and 
Terry Curd are working on 
journalism Brenda Albus and 
Toni Roach are in the one-act 
P**>

C O N V E N TIO N  A C TIV IT IE S
b> Judy Morgan

The EH A area meeting was 
held in Stephens ille on March 
6. l i f t .  The theme for the 
area meeting was "America 
The Beautiful 1776 l*»7«," . 
The meeting itself was at the 
auditorium at Tarlrton Stale 
University.

The girls attending the 
meeting left Ertday al 12 00. 
Hie following girls attended 
the meeting: Patti Counts. 
Sarah M iG aughrv. Rhonda

Skiles Irene Flore*. Jan Low 
rey. Marylon Bun. Ttmilu 
Graham. Marcella Durham 
Sherrs Jackson, and Juds 
Morgan Mrs Florence M..r 
gan and Mrs Vera Newn.n 
accompanied the group 

Friday night. Mrs Newton 
and Patti Count* attended a 
dinner honoring area officers 
and iheir advisors. The offi- 
cers reviewed plan* and made
final

PREPARE I N F A N T  
N U L A S  C A R E F U L L Y !

nn-cuMrnlralrd Infant formula ran have 
I twwKjurnirs according lo v im r rrcrnll v 
Mr* taw historic*. Boilrd skim milk, 
rtv kklii powdered or evaporated milk and 

aaal poparts dllulrd can pul a heavy load 
lyniMaaivrr kidney, Jeopard!»e the infant* 

nudnakr It vunrrable to development 
raad renal failure.

i Me to ciuttoa ill mother* buying infant 
i lo he aw*te ol the need foe proper dilution 

^kriware of the dangers of preparing "rtch"
i nitlures

l GREAT M ANY PEOPLE E N T R U S T  US 
air prescriptions health needs and other 
*> products. We < onsider this trust a 

ind a duty May we be your personal
i pkarmacy?"

JONES 
IARMACY _

KNOX C7TT. TEXASItt-UIJ
' ^ 6 - 1 9 1 ^

Something Added
hail i n s u r a n c e  o n  w h e a t

W IT H  F IR E  IN C L U D E D

By endorsement, we can add 
Wind and Tornado Coverage

to our policy for a small additional premium

J U S T  W H A T  W E  H A V E  A L L  W A N T E D )

WALLACE M00RH0USE INSURANCE
1 t V a u a  a s ----*  — — -  - — _ _ — a^ — ^T r r i i B B i i t a  t a r  r f t m a k b a

'nturancn-RMl Eitata - Appralaals-Mo'tayja Loan*

hm-UH’ , 422-4141 P O  Drawer 9 Mundav lew s ’ 6 J 'I

MBULANCE SERVICE RATES
'LL BE C H A R G E D  A S  F O L L O W S :

WCity $25.00
lrt*h, Rochester, Benjamin $35.00 
‘»ne $90.00
’•la Falls $95.00

-or com parable distances-
Oher rates will be determined by mileage 

rOR A M B U LA N C E  SERVICE. CALL 
*56-3313 days or 666-3376 nights

c ' » y  o f f  K n o x  C i t y

Seniors Week
| LUNCHROOM  

M ENUS
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Girls Place 
A t First Meet

And Thgir Autobiographies 

•nm m n m

preparation* for the
Saturday session 

The remaining group en- 
K>ycd a Fi*h Dinner and 
bowling on Friday night 

Guevt *peaker* were Mr 
Sieve Slroope. Mimvier of 
Youth at the Firvl Baptist 
Church Abilene, and Mr* 
Janiee C ord, a former Mi** 
Teaav Mr Slroope- centered 
in on knowing real love. Hr 
said that you didn't |u»l fall in 
love hut iHal 11 wa* a maiurt 
QSCIMOft to love soim-olie 
Mrs ( .ird sang 4nd i|„-„ 
tailed some about how she 
got io he Miss fc*a% She 
cmphevi/cd that everyom 
should know ihcir abihliev 
and work to develop then 
strong points

Pam ( oums presented 
various parts of ihe program 
Saturdav as a pan of her 
responsibilities av Area IV 
Fifth Vtee President.

The delegates returned 
horn- Saturday mghl. Thev 
weri tired and wears but all 
agreed it had been a good 
trip

FFA  NEWS 
by Brel l Hoonr

This week we arc all gelling 
ready lor upcoming judging 
contests Wc will he judging 
grasses, dairy cattle, dairy 
products, and livestock for 
meal production

For the freshmen: Good 
News and Had News, The 
Good News is ihal the closer 
lo the end of school, the less 
chance of initiation. The Bad 
News is ihal if (and when) we 
have initiation we have had a 
lot ol lime lo think up G R EAT 
ideas for it.

P S I faked you out about 
the "Good News"!

B E TA  C LU B  N f MS 
bv Rav Ihompson

A week ago todav the Beta 
Club held its March meeting 
Recruitment of new members 
wav discussed. Also . active 
ties lor the remainder ol the 
year were planned

I hose present at (he meet 
ing included Ricky Bishop. 
Tinu Graham. Pam Skiles. 
Sarah McGaughcv. C .H  Un 
derwood. and Rav lh*m:pson

•o u w q v

&  A  %
%

R IC K  T A N K E R S L E Y

Kick Tankersley was born 
in Mr and Mrs lb ,shell
I ankcrslcv of Knot City on 
April 9, |9s7.

He has lived in Kno* City 
b*r eighteen years and at­
tended school here also.

Kick has been in band for 
eight years and PASF for two 
sears He was in the Junior 
play and did Ihe stage tor ihe 
Senior plav.

His favorite things are 
musics from ihe 1940* and 
Chinese lood.

People he admire are Ellon 
John and Hob Mackic

He plans lo attend 
Me Murry College in Abilene, 
n ijjorng  in art.

Denise Diaz Robbie large, 
t(>ri Rasco. Shannon linkers 
Icy. Laurie Webb 
Second Grade; Leal; Boone, 
Paula Chambers. D'Lavna 
Douglas. Kay Hernandez, 
lerrv low rey. Barbie Me 
Gaughcv. Mi, had Kauch (99 
plus). Tamms Rogers. Becky 
Underwood |99 plus), Celia 
Wlusenhum
third Grade Kltondj Avefitt, 
Pin Ills Boll.m Sl.irk Delg.i 
tin Steven While. Iviui M< 
O ars. Melissa Pierce 
I uurlh tirade: Mn belle Hole 
nun. Becky Holton. Sieve 
Rutherford. Greg Skiles, 
c had Nboles
fifth (>rade: Je m  Grimslev, 
Dune Helms. David Lank 
lord. Jim McCrary. Tyke 
Mcinzcr
Sivih Grad* Melissa Whltlcv 
Seventh Grade: Kelly Boone
Kav Farim-r, Kav Howell. 
Sues leach. Jay Rutherford. 
Adam White
t Ighlh Grade: (v ie  Clayton. 
Junior Figueroa. Deann 
Stamps. G em  Walson. Sam 
While. Kenny Cornwell 
Ninth Grade: Jodie Mi
Gaughcv
lenlh Gradri David Ander 
son Brett Boone. Junior Gon 
/al, s. Judy Jfcrrmg. Mike 
Howell. Tommy Mangts 
I wclllh C.rade: Jane Arledge. 
Al Hanman. Kicky Bishop, 
lisa Cockrell, Pam Counts. 
Ttmtlu Graham. Mark Ho­
well. Jimmy Lynn. Jimmy 
Don Moore, Jerry Stamps. 
Sands Stubbs, Ray Thompson

f ROM N f W M EX IC O
Mr and Mrs Wvndoll 

Stephens and Rod of Jal. New 
M em o arc visiting here this 
week with his mother. Mrs
O/etlc Stephens.

fhev also visited with his 
sister and her family, the

M A R C E L L A  D U R H A M

Marcella, daughter of Mrs 
B K Durham was born on 
October 8, I957 m the Kno* 
County Hospital Two and a 
hall years laler a brolher. 
Charles, was born She has 
gone to school in Kno* Cilv all 
twelve years.

She has been a member of 
FHA for four years where she 
has completed two phases of
F.m winter, and has served as 
a voiing delegate al the Area 
Chapter IV meetings She has 
also been a member of choir 
for four vears. pep club for 
three vears. Library Staff for 
on< year (where she was 
awarded a library pin) and 
has b- en on Ihe office staff for 
two vears

Marcella was also a candi­
date |,>r Miss Spirit ol ' 76 
when she represented Harney 
Arnold Real Fstalr.

She is a member id the 
Firsi Baptist Church where 
she has attended Sunday 
Sch-iol and not missed a 
Sunday in eleven years. She 
has been awarded a pin each 
year

Some of her hobbies in­
clude swimming. needle­
point babysitting, and ballet.

I he person she admires Ihe 
most ol all is her mother.

Mlcr graduation, she plans 
lo attend lesas Stale Techni­
cal Insiiiulc and become a 
denial assistant.

IN LAWSON IIO M f
Recent visitors in the home 

ol Mr and Mrs. Ken lawson 
have b u n  her brother. Rav 
Hromh v ,-t El Dorado. Arkan 
vas: her mother. Mrs Mollie 
Hromlcv ol Mundav. and their 
son, Kennv lawson of Wuhi 
la Falls

IN HODGES I IO M f
Mars ami Helen Stephens 

of Lubhuk sjH-nl Sundav in 
Ihe ho mi of Mr and Mrs 
George Hodges

Thev had been in Rule 
visiting I heir aunl, Mrs Doss 
fuller, and were reluming 
home

B R fA K F A S T M ENUS 
M ARCH 15-19, 197ft 
Monday: Change Wedges. 
Peanut Butter Whip, Butter 
ed Toast, Milk 
Tuesday: Orange Juice,
Scrambled Fggs. Buttered 
Toast with Jelly. Milk 
Wednesday: Grape Juice,
Sausage. Buttered Toast with 
Jelly. Milk
Thursdavi Orange Juice. Pan 
Cake* with Syrup and Butter. 
Milk
Friday: Applesauce. Cinna­
mon Toast. Milk 

LUN CH  MENUS 
M ARCH 15-19, 1976 
Monday: Oven Fried Fl»h and 
Macorom with Cheese. Black 
eyed Peas, Crisp Carrot 
Slicks. Thick Sliced Toast 
with Butler. Chilled Pear*. 
Milk
Tuesday: Hamburger or
CJu-t-*ebuger. Burger I rim 
mins, Green Bean*. Pine 
apple Pudding. Fritos. Milk 
W ednrsdav i Chili Con (  arm 
with Bean*. (o le  Slaw. 
French Fries, Hoi Corn Bread 
with Butter. Haystaek Coo­
kie*. Milk

Thursdavi Hamburger Piz­
za with Cheese. C ombination 
Salad. Seasoned Squavh. 
Cherry ' obbler Milk 
Friday: Fried Chicken.
Whipped Potatoes. Gravy. 
Seasoned Beets. Hot Rolls 
with Butter. Peanut Butter 
( aki a ith It ing Mdk

Crowell 
Falls To 
Broaddus

District 7 A champions, the 
Crowell Wildcats. almost 
made it to the top before 
falling in the Stale Class A 
finals at Gregory Gym in 
Austin Saturday mghl to 
powerful Broaddus M2 4b tn 
Ihe championship game

Saturday morning. the 
WiMeats ol O u c h  RanttaX
Rvan defeated C oppell 62 ’ 4 
in overtime m the semifinals 
to reach ihe final game 
Broadus. which now has won 
15 games in a row this season 
after a two point loss in its 
'pener, edged Brazos Conso 

hdated 7| r>9 in the other 
semifinal game

It has been lb  years since 
Crowell Iasi went lo the state 
tournament in the finals.

Crowell, which finished its 
season with 2 ' 10record, was 
apparently worn out from its 
overtime victors over Coppell, 
the regional winner over Ar 
her Citv. and the Wildcats 

had little left in the finals.

Lewis Paint &  Body Shop
[S terling Lewis. Ow ner Telephone 650-3342 

NIOHTS DIAL 666-3330

Not only did the Kno* City 
hoys get their track season off 
to a fast start Saturday, the 
KC girl* ran in relays held at 
Notre Dame High ScIkxiI in 
Wichita Fall*

The team, coached by Ste­
phen Mdlhaney, scored a 
total of 52 point* with Jewell 
Culberson winning Kno* 
Cily'a only first place with her 
discus throw of 103'I I " .

Second place honor* on the 
tram went to Debbie Ray with 
a 28.5 In the 220 yard dash. 
Beverly Ward with a 7.5 on 
the bO yard dash, and the 880 
yard relay consisting of 
Beverly Ward. Gayle Ware. 
Cynthia Rhodes, and Debbie 
Kay with a time of 1:55.8.

Toni Roach placed fifth in 
the long jump with a jump ol 
I4 '9 )»"  and suth place win­
ner* were the 440 relay team 
of Sheryll Guinn. Rhodes. 
Culberson, and Ward running 
in 56.0. the mile relay team of 
Guinn. Culberson. Ware, and 
Kay with a 5:02.5 time, and 
Kay in the shot put with a 
28'6" throw

The only girl lo place in the 
junior high division was Be 
linda Rogers, who took fourth 
place in the shot put.

Track schedule lor the high 
school girls for the remainder 
of the season will be as 
follows:
March 13 Olney
March 26 Burkburnetl
April 2 Javton

The Junior High track ache 
dule ia:
March 12 Olnev

March 25 Kno* City
Both the high school and 

junior high teams will be 
entered in the district track 
meet to be held at Jay ton on 
April 6.

School
Calendar

I Sunday, March 11 Bus Dri­
ver Training. 5:30-8:00 p m 
friday, March 12 - Junior 
Plays. "Adam  and Eve" and 

Bench l8 " -7 :3 0  p m 
Saturday, March 13 -Olney 
Track, girls; Graham Track, 
boys
Monday. March IS— Bus Dri­
ver Training. 5:10-8:00 p.m. 
lueaday, March 16 Golf al 
Paducah. FH A  Meeting at 
7:(JO p m ; Board Meeting 
U n tn n d a i. March 17 Band 
Contest, Concert and Sight 
Reading. Vernon, all day

It's Your Horm 
. .  . Protect h

Baker-Clonts 
Insurance

658-1621

DANCE
To  The Best!

S o t .  N i g h t ,  M a r c h  1 3

Rhineland Gym 

9-1
Admission $2.50 per person

Jerrv Guin

R
mmm

'ard’s Hocus Pt*cus
FRIDAY

A YSPECIi
P R E S TO N  M il

Vjgal. J C C
LK P R E S TO N  B R E A D

45c
f o l g e r s c o f i

2  lb can ^ 2

- e e  c a b b a g e  

• " >  10<
7-Up Sugar Free 32oz (Returnable) 4 FOR $  1

Deposit required
Hormei ^
Vienna Sausage

Use your 
Electric 

Clothe$ Dryer 
Wisely...

A 'l i )

Reddys 
Helpful Tips

* O pe rit*  ytMir (fryer wittia f -1

*
and tear and yarttowmg m addition

to using more energy
e Use ieTtf'Vfi’'f rit to df y I j ht ' v ! if*t t -f merits 

and only partially dry items which are to be 
pressed immediately

«  K»~f| t filter clean A dirty »nt filter < ■" 
lengthen the drying time and present a 
fire hazard

* Vent y« Iryer to m< h i • dsetfi t- y 
Occasionally check the vent to make sure it is 
not t logged A t logged vent can cause your 
dryer to consume needless energy and presents 
a potential fire hazard

A*tli up fttyt f t f f l  copy ol 

INMK.Y CONSfevATION 
Book I*» from

nf lo  FWgidaire
Mo mg itviiiw of •••*»•• *••••»•

f  Wrsi IexasUttlti
. \ 

tics
C om pany mm

Remember IftEDBY Supplies the energy- 

but only Y O U  u n  use it wisely!
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SUPER MARKETS

KNOX C ITY

SPECIALS GOOD 
T H U R ..FR I..SA T ., 
MARCH 1112-13

GET YOUR NEW $ & H GREEN . 
CATALOGUE NOW AT M SYSTEM!

&

DO UBLE
S & H GREEN STAMPS

W E D N E S D A Y S
Will The Pi'ckm 
01 SI 50 0< Note

■••MT 
■ iu a v ( »
TO U « l t  / /

VEGETABLEALL
CD SCO

C A N3 LB

290 1
STRAWBERRIES

FROZEN FRESH

1 0  01.
PKGS.

DriWontf

KOUNTRY FRESH b a

Whipping Cream 2- 79'
Half
Pints

U  o z .  BOTTLES

F O R

FARM FRESH
Produce
660 S A L E

U P T O N

R U B Y  R E D

GRAPEFRUIT

5>:*66*

1

3
R U S S E T

POTATOES

i  B « o  h  6 ̂

i

R E D  R O M E

APPLES
3 66*

i

a

F L O R I D A  S W E E T

C O R N
1̂ 66*

T E X A S  J U I C E

ORANGES
5 &  6 6 <

Instant Tea
O AWN

Detergent_
Mazola Oil

3-oz. JAR 1.39
22-oz. BOTTLE

32 O Z. JAR

Peanut Butter
COLGATE-AEROSOL CAN

Shave Cream
MENTHOLATUM

Ointment_____

I  K O L D  K O U N T R Y
I FROZEN
I O R A N G  
! J U I C E
5 101.

CANS

1 S C O T T  V I V A KIMBELL SALAD P I N T O

1 TO W ELS DRESSING B E A N S
1 7 4 9 * o i l  it g g c 3

KOUNTRY FRESH I
COTTAGE
CHEESE

16 oz. 
CTN. 59

KOUNTRY FRESH - I

SLAB SLICED

U S © ! * ® * ® * © ’* ® 1

MILK 1
6AU0N FUSTIC JUG

*1.59
Fresh Ground Beef

j Pork Roast_______
| Franks 
I Margarine

A R M O U R  S T A R

" 8 9
“  9 8

12 OZ. C O
p k 6.

u  4 9Plaotic
T u b

K O U N T R Y  FRESH

4


