
E KNOX COUNTY NEWS
R 43 KNOX CITY. KNOX COUNTY. TEXAS 79529 THURSDAY, AUGUST 7, 1975 Single Copy Price 15c, Including Tax

ay 6 
ough KC

to l Ik City
Chamber of Commerce of­

ficials. (he Knot County Com­
missioners Court, and Judge 
Sam Clontx presented the 
request to the commission 
about l * o  years ago.

The action will become 
effective on January I ,  1976, 
and new route markers will be 
in place when the depart­
ment's 197b official highway 
travel map is released to the 
public

In recent months, the farm 
to market road west of Knot 
City w as designated as a part 
of State Highway 222.

Officials feel that the chan­
ges will definitely benefit the 
area as better maintenance on 
primary roads can be expect­
ed.

Teachers Report August 18

Knox City Schools Begin 
1975-76 Term August 22
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Baseball Teams 
Plan Social Aug. 14

All Senior League and Lillie 
League players and their par­
ents are invited to an ice 
cream and cake supper, 
Thursday night. August 14. at 
the City Park at 7:30 o'clock, 
according to Doug Mein/er, 
president.

All players are asked to 
turn in your uniforms at this 
lime and also the all-star 
uniforms. Metnzcr said.

NEW ARRIVALS IN KNOX CITY are Ihe Stephen
Mcllhaneys. pictured here with their two children. 
Luci and Rob Mcllhaney has been employed as girls' 
athletic coach by the KC Schools

Mcllhaneys Move Here
Moving to Knot City last 

week from Garden City. Tex­
as. were Stephen M'llhaney. 
his wife. Dana, and two 
children. Luci. 4. and Kob. 10 
months.

Mcllhaney has been hired 
by Ihe Knox City Schools as 
girls' athletic coach.
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STEP To Employ 
Knox County Workers
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WACO--1 he Texas Farm­
ers Union lodav announced 
that ihe Senior Texans Em­
ployment Program will be 
expanding to include Knox 
County in September STEP 
was established in 197] by the 
Texas Legislature as a com­
pletely state funded work 
program for older citizen*. 
STEP workers must be at 
least fifty-five years of age 
and fall within income restric­
tions to be eligible for Ihe 
program Upon cmplovmcnt. 
the workers will work part- 
time for tax-based entities in
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thousand cubic feet of gas 
According to Yates, the city 
gate rate applies to natural 
gas delivered by Lone Star's 
Transmission Division to its 
distribution divisions for sale 
to residential and commercial 
users The new rate replaces 
a temporary emergency rate 
of 94 19 tents per thousand 
cubic feet set bv the Railroad 
Commission on May I. 1975

Yates explained that the 
new rate will increase Knox 
City residential customers' 
gas bills by about 34 4ft a 
month.

Included in the most recent 
Railroad Commission order 
was the authorization to in­
crease Lone Star’s automatic 
pass-on of increased gas costs 
to AS per cent adjusted
monthly, lone Star was for­
merly allowed to only pass 65 
per cent of Itheir increased 
coats for gas every six
months Yates said that Lone 
Star was also seeking to have 
this provtxion included in the 
new city rate ordinance

Yatex noted that the 
I I  0399 figure authorized by 
the Railroad Commission was 
arrived at after reviewing the 
evidence thick reflected 
31 20 a* show n by the l  om 
pans and 914 cents as testified 
to by the cities In addition to 
the mcreaaed rates for rest 
dential and commercial cus 
loners, Yales said the Rail 
road Commission's order is 
designed to provide Lone Star 
an eight per cent rale of 
return on ihe fair value rale 
base set by the Commission

the county, such as school 
districts, municipalities, and 
the county government The 
men workers will form a crew 
to perform renovation, reslo 
ration, and landscape pro­
jects. while the women will be 
placed individually as teacher 
aides, library assistants, or in 
other public service positions 
STEP workers are not allowed 
to do maintenance work, such 
as floor sweeping or mopping 
or lawn mowing, and musl he 
engaged in permanent im­
provement projects of lading 
value to the community 

STEP Director Bob Carroll 
wilt be in Benjamin at the 
County Judge's office from 
9 00 to noon on August 12 and 
in Knox City at the school 
administration building that 
afternoon from 2:00 to 5 00 to 
interview STEP applicants. 
Six or eighi persons will be 
hired, and all residents of 
Knox County who meet the 
age and income requirements 
and who are physically able to 
work are invited to come by 
and visit with Carroll. Those 
who are unable to come by for 
a personal interview but 
would like an application may 
write STEP. 800 Lake Air 
Drive. Waco. Texas 76710.

The Millhancy* are both 
natives of Temple. Oklahoma, 
and both finished high school 
there. Coach Mcllhaney re 
ceised the Bachelor of Science 
degree in education at M id ­
western University in Wichita 
Falls. Hr served as girls' 
coach and taught history and 
driver's education for four 
years in Garden City.

Mrs Millhanev was previ­
ously employed by IBM and 
later worked in a finance 
office.

The Mcllhaneys, who re 
sTde al SfTI ^EpeffT IW ^IlW
member* of the First United 
Methodist Church here

Another summer has gone 
and the 1975-76 School Year 
looms just around the corner 
Teachers will report for duty 
and lour days of In Service 
Monday. August 18, and stu­
dents will begin school on 
Frida >. August 22

In Service will begin al 8 30 
Monday morning in the high 
•eftool library. Tuesday and 
Wednesday, teachers will at­
tend the Haskell Knox Co Op 
In-Service at Munday and will 
return to this campus Thurs­
day for more In-Service and 
High School registration 
Thursday afternoon

High school students will 
register Thursday afternoon. 
August 21 at the following 
times
1:00 I 45 Seniors
I 4 J 30 Juniors
2:30 J: IS Sophomores
J:IS 4 00 Freshmen

Grades K through 8 will not 
pre register

Friday will be a regular 
school day with buses run­
ning. lunch served (no break 
fast served the first day only), 
bells al 8:25 and 3:50, desks 
assigned, books passed out 
and students settling in.

Children enrolling in Kin­
dergarten need lo bring their 
birth certificate, an immuni­
zation record from the family 
doctor, and be accompanied 
bv one parent or adult guard 
ian

Lunch prices will remain 
' rrffc'stTWf as fa<t vear 70 cents 

for adults. SO cents for grades 
5-12. and 45 cents for K 4

Funds For Arthritis 
Being Sought By Mail

Residents of Knox County 
will receive letters this week 
on behalf of the Plains Dtvi 
sum. West Texas Chapter, of 
The Arthritis Foundation

These letters will take Ihe 
place of a house to house 
campaign, viltciting funds lo 
continue the maintenance of 
(he chapter's projects in cdu 
cation and research at Texas 
Tech University School of 
Mediune in Lubbock. Billie 
and Buddy Angle, owners of 
the Knox County News and 
authors of the letter, explain 
ed that 6S% of the funds 
raised in West Texas remain 
in West Texas.

The West Texas Chapter 
was instrumental m getting 
a Dcjiartmcnt of Rheumato­
logy at Texas Tech University 
School of Medicine. Less than 
one third of the medical

Faculty Completed 
At Carney School

C arney Independent School 
District will begin classes 
Friday morning. August 22. 
at 8 JO o'clock The buses will 
run their usual routes and the 
cafeteria will be in operation, 
according to Ed Whitelv, 
superintendent

All teachers and aides will 
participate in an in service 
workshop the week of August 
18 21 inclusive, beginning al 
9 00 a m

On Thursday. August 21, 
all students will register he

Weather

ginning al 9 00 a m and Mr 
Whitel* stated it was impor 
tani that all students be there 
Students enrolling for the first 
time in O'Brien are asked to 
bring a copy of their birth 
certificate and immunization 
record. Mr Whitely said

Ihe faculty is now complete 
and the new teachers are 
Miss Juanema Westmoland 
Mrs Mildred Simpson, and 
Gu* Young

Miss Westmoland, girls' 
basketball coach, received her 
Bac he lor of Science degree 
from Hardin Simmons and 
her master’s degree from 
Teta* Tech

Mrs Simpson. resource
dale law high rain teacher, received her mas
7 JO 68 93 let's from Texas Tech also
7-31 69 9J 02 (>us Young wilt he principal
8 1 70 87 and also teach math Mr
8 2 70 87 02 Young who also has his
8 3 67 87 09 masirr % degree, taught Ihe
8 4 60 89 past two sears tn As per morn
8-5 60 89 and m Hamlin seventeen
8 6 60 years

Breakfast will be 30 cents for 
adults and 20 cents for stu­
dents Free breakfast and 
lunches are available lo stu­
dents who need them to 
request. Free lunch applica­
tions are given lo every 
student the first day of school, 
as well as several other forms 
for parental permit* on. insu­
rance. and miscellaneous 
forms that need • be looked 
over by the parents and 
relumed marked accordingly 

Teachers for the coming 
year inlcude Mrs Joanna 
Delgado. Early Childhood Ed 
ucation. Mrs Margie Oonts. 
Kindergarten. Mrs Louise 
Kemletz. First Grade Mrs. 
Ha/el Long. Second Gr*<t«-; 
Mrs Linda Underwood. Third

tirade. Mrs. Earlene Austin, 
Fourth Grade

Fifth through the Flighth 
Grades will be departments 
li/cd with Ronnie Verhalen. 
Mrs Frankie Hakci. and Mrs 
Mary Jo Lankford as home­
room teachers Other teach­
ers will include coaches, 
band. math, and reading tab 
teachers.

Mrs. Frances King will be 
in charge of the Mid Range 
Resource room. One more 
Resource teacher may be 
hired if Title One funds 
application is approved Mo­
dified Academic classes in 
high school will be taught by 
Mrs. Zoy Risinger and Leo­
nard Morgan

Mrs Florence Morgan will

KC Grant Approved

schools in the United States 
have such departments, and 
there are only about 2200 
rheumatologists in the nation 
The chapter has also estab 
iished and maintains a re­
search lab. as well as scholar 
ship and fellowship funds that 
go to West Texas young men 
and women at TTUSM who 
with to pursue the study of 
arthritis and the rheumatic- 
diseases. These projects are 
funded strictly by West Texas 
monies.

Arthritis is the nation's 
number one crippler Con 
irary to popular belief that 
arthritis is an "old folk ' 
disease, rheumatoid, which is 
the most crippling, painfui 
and prevalent type, strikes 
trom birth to age 30 or 40 
Each year 250.000 children 
are diagnosed as having anh 
mis. some infants are born 
with it. The economic toll in 
lost time and wages and 
medical bills each year ex 
ceeds 39 3 billion dollar*, and 
the American people are rip 
ped off to Ihe tune of 3408 
million in quack “ currs" amt 
remedies annually

Knox County residents are 
urged to tuppiwt the efforts of 
(he West Texas Chapter hv 
rrs|M>nding ax generously as 
possible when they receive 
their letters this week

SS Representative 
To Be In KC Aug 14

la r i  Beisner. claims reprr 
sentative from the Vernon 
Social Security Office will he 
in Knox City Thursday. Au 
gust 14

He will he al ihe City Hall 
between the hours of 10 00 
a m and noon to answer 
questions on social security 
matters and to take applica 
lions from those wishing to 
file claims

The City of Knox City hax 
been advised by Congress­
man Omar Burleson that the 
application for a S 100.000.00 
Community Development 
Block Grant to Knox City has 
been approved by the Depart­
ment of Housing and Urban 
Development.

Purpose of the grant ta to 
provide fund* for water sys- 
tem improvements

Knox City wax one of seven 
towns invited to file a full

Two-A-Days 
W ill Begin 
On Monday

Coaches Jimmy Rogers, 
Jerry Lowrey. and Tommy 
Sloan returned Friday from 
the 43rd annual T rias Coach­
ing School held July 27 
through August I in Fori 
Worth

The highlights of the school 
were the All Star basketball 
game and the football game

This week Ihe coaches are 
ptrpartng for the coming 
week of two a-day work-outs 
which will begin Monday, 
August I I ,  and continue 
through August 22 at 8 a m 
and 6 p m .

Parents of high school ath­
letes are asked to come by the 
school this Thursday morning 
from 9:00 to 12 00 to chec k on 
insurance

Athletes are reminded to 
come to the Field House 
Friday morning to check on 
their equipment. Coach Ri*g- 
ers said

KC Men First 
In Own Tourney

J B Tabor and Jeff Gra­
ham teamed up to fire a 
two round total of 127 to take 
first place in the Louisiana 
Draw Men's Partnership to .r- 
nev held Saturday and Sun 
das at the Knox Cits Country 
Club.

Graham sank a 12 foot putt 
on the last hole to cinch the 
i hamptonshtp

Louis Conn and ("ids Willi 
ams were second with 128. 
followed by Joel Bevel and 
1 A Watson with 110

In the First flight. Donmte 
Johnston of Lubbock and 

Rogers lankford of Abilene 
took top honors with 140, 
followed by l  ari Shelton and 
Billy Mitchell with 141, 
Marttz and Ballard came in 
third with 142

James Retd of O'Brien 
carded a hole in one on the 
number two hole. 151 yards 
on the fly. during Sunday's 
play, a spokesman reported

Tournament chairmen were 
Willard Skiles and M ai Ver 
halen

application for discretionary 
Community Development 
funds in March of this year.

Other towns in the area 
who receised the invitation 
from HUD included Cisco, 
Santa Anna, Sweetwater, 
Coleman, Brown wood, and 
DeLeon.

Knox City's application for 
the full discretionary grant in 
the amount of 3 UK).000.00 
was requested tor improve­
ments including water mam 
replacements and externum*, 
installation of fire hydrants, 
and demolition equipment, 
according to Mrs Faye Rails 
back, etts secretary

The federal money is pa.. 
of a housing and community 
devt lopment project designed 
to eliminate urban blight.

head the Migrant Program.
High School teachers will 

include Mrs Kenella Watson. 
Flnglish and Business. C.H  
Underwood. English and So­
cial Studies: James Retd.
Mathemalus. B R Winches 
ter. Science. Mrs Dottie Low- 
rev. Business; Mrs Vera 
Newton. Vocational Home 
making. Leon Burkham and 
Jim Dillon. Vocational Agri­
culture: Leonard Morgan,
C.V.A E and Resource. Hu­
bert Seale. Band

Jimmy Rogers. Jerry Low­
rey. tommy Sloan, and Ste­
phen Mcllhaney will share 
coaching duties and teach 
Social Studies. Drivers Ezlu 
cation. Speech. Math, and 
Health Classes

Aides assisting the tea 
chers throughout the aystem 
will be B,rdir Helton. Kinder 
garten. Idella Escobar. Re 
source; Jan lankford. Re 
source; Janice Johnston, Re 
source, and Barbara McCau- 
ghev. Reading

Special Services will be 
provided by M r* Wretha 
Fitzgerald. Nurse, and Mrs 
LaRuc Reeves. Counselor. 
Bus Drivers will be Leroy 
Davis and Jerry Johnston 

lunchroom personnel will 
be Mrs Ramona Helms, Su 
persisor, M r* Pearl Eaton. 
Mrs Pat Gnmsley. and Mrs 
Elaine Lewis. James Hewitt it 
School Custodian

Administration includes 
W R Baker. Superintendent 
Bill Holcomb, Principal, Mrs 
Mars Beth Smith. Business 
Manager. Mrs Melanie 
Whitley. Secretary; and Oscar 
Mangis. lax Assessor-Collec­
tor

KC Principal Explains 
Three Quarter System

During the I97S-76 school 
year, the Knox City Schools 
will use the Quarter System 
instead of the old Semester 
System There will he few 
actual changes according to 
Principal Bill Holcomb, who 
offers this explanation of the 
new Quarter System

"The ft2nd Session of the 
Texas Legislature in )97| 
enacted a law which changes 
tcho-c operation from a se­
mester system to a quarter 
system Some school districts 
in Trias agreed to pilot test 
the quarter ssstem during the 
1972•"3 school year

"The ft3rd Legislature 
changed the deadline for 
slalewidr implementation of 
the system to begin in Sep 
tember 1975.

" It  is hoped that the follow­
ing material answers some of 
the questions which have 
been asked about the quarter 
system lor t r i a *  School* "

The quarter system is a 
new was of dividing the 
school calendar year Instead 
of two semester*, the school 
year will now have four three 
month term* or quarters 
Three quarter* will provide 
180 d a\* of m*truction to 
meet attendance require­
ment* During the summer 
quarter a regular summer 
school can he held Like any 
school plan, the quarter sys­
tem can he developed and 
modified to fit the need* of 
the local - -immunity It make* 
possible more c omplete use of 
school facilities and more 
flexihilits in scheduling and 
curriculum and provides add­
ed educational opportunities 
for our young people

Did You Know
that Mrs I H Barnard Rl 1, 
Box 40 Munson. Washington 
98831 subscribes to The Knox 
Counts News’

Some more point* of tnte- 
re*t listed in "Teias School* 
and the Quarter System" 
published by Ihe Texa* Edu 
cation Agency are:

District* will decide which 
option* of the quarter xystem 
to implement in their school*

A school must operate at 
least three quarters, provid­
ing 180 davs of instruction. 
Local districts are not requtr 
rd to operate a fourth quarter, 
students are not required to

See PRINCIPAL p«. 3

CofC Plans 
Are Discussed 
At Breakfast

The monthly breakfast for 
Chamber of Commerce direc­
tors was held Tuesday morn­
ing al Korner Kitchen with 
vice president J R Tabor and 
secretars manager Dona 
Crow nos er presiding in the 
absence oi president David 
Counts

Present in addition to Tabor 
and M r* Crow novel were Bill 
Baker. Buford Wright. Billve 
Angle, and youth director 
Jimmy Lynn

Mrs Crownover advised 
the directors of the approval 
of the re routing of State 
Highway ft which will now 
come through our town and 
the group felt that Judge Sam 
Clont* should be commended 
for the work he did toward
this

The group alto told that the 
annual sidewalk sale, tpnn 
sored by Knox City mer­
chants. will he held again Ihta 
fall

Tabor presented the sug­
gestion that Mrs, Crownover 
hr sent to a workshop for

Sec CofC Pit. 3
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TWO residential WKv (or u k  
* ith concrete cellar and •  10 l  
10 utility building Eva Pro
man b58 3513 7.J1 flc

FOR SALE: 350 Honda low 
mileage, good condition Call 
C H Gideon 658-3849 
7 31 lip

WEDDING invitations. an 
nouncementv. informal notea. 
booky. and other vestal needy 
The Knoi Coum> News

SALE on inode and outvide 
paint KNOX BUILDERS 
SUPPLY ~ 24 4u

USED Speed (Jucen Wavher 
and drver (or vale See Derrell 
Marion or call 058-3(134 
7 34 tie ■■■ ■ ------
U k t  NEW Electric Range 
»ith iclf-cleaning oven Used 
lea* thaa 2 yean S125 Call 
058 3492 after 5 p m
8-’  Itc

CLEAN EXPENSISF .arpety 
with the best- Blue luvtre is 
America’a favorite Rent 
yhampooer. SI PERRYS. 
Knox City 8-7 lie

F ARM 8 RANCH WELDING.
portable w elder Building
pipe for yaie. different sues. 
Will build peny and barns 
Call Homer Rolaton. 817 
454-3341 Benjamin l-IOtfc

W ANTED: To do hay-baling 
cuatom plowing, cattle haul­
ing See Donnie Taylor or call 
058-31W 6-12 tfc

0 H. Bartley 
Registered 

Public Surveyor
Phone 888 2454 
Seimour. f t  taa

T  *4  C o m p l e t e  
H o u s e  

R e m o d e l i n g
New t abtaetv. V anitiev.

Built laa. Paneling 
Repair Re Root New 

siding and M arai 
W

( owtraet t ompielr Job

M M B O O E
C ar penrer -< onrrartnr 

Box 431 F»on# 422-430C 
Viuvlay, Taiaa 78371

BAYLOR MILLING CO.
Throckmorton Highway. Sec 
mour Custom Mixing Pel­
leting Your grain or ours. 
Range cubes, creep feeds, 
hog feeds, start to finish 
w  W>|____________IQ-IOrf,,

MR SRETL H Instant VAairt
(ofors ideal for children's 
gittv Available in two sues. 
S4 00 and 15 45 The Knot 
fnumy News

FOR SALEi 50cedar posts. 50 
cents each if you haul off 
Used water heater, still has 
guarantee 400 N 3rd

—
JUST ARRIS FD at the New*
office- Flair Hardhead. Ptav 
tic Point pen available in blue, 
black, green, and red. 79 
cents

CARPET Specials and no was 
Armstrong floor covering 
KNOX BUILDERS SI PPLY
" 24 4lc

FOR SALE- Traditvmal Sole 
brown tapestrv couch, like 
new SI50 Earlv American 
swivel rocker and also occa­
sional chair Mrs Greg Ze«- 
sel Mundav. 817-422 4048
- _________________

SEE YOLR MONUMENTS
before vou buy More than 50 
designs to choose from Also 
curb work J C. McGee 
10-21 tfc__________________

KELLY DITLHING S I RS ICE
24", 12". 8" . 6"  ditch.
Plastic pipe, fittings Sewer 
pipe Phone 915 773-3939 
Bot I ’ d, Stamford. Texas 
4-3 4tp 5-1 tfc

FOR SALE -l heap Twotteel 
cots and spnngs with a good 
clean Morning Glory Matt­
ress. H  E Wall 8-7 | tp

SPECIAL: Pre finished wal­
nut slab doors. 20"x80". 
Ideal for shelving While they 
last. S2 00 each KNOX 
BUILDERS SUPPLY

NE E D IY PE VS R l im  r Add
mg Machine Ribbons? 'Ve 
have a g>«d selection of these 
as well as typing paper 
carbon and pencils The 
Knot Counts New s tcnc

HYDRAULIC Hose Repair 
bolls and plow bolts KNOX 
BUILDERS SI PPIY 7 24 4tc

f lQ Q U O T IjJ U
SUPPLIES C  
and EQ U IPM

HESTER IRRIGATION
ALTON HESTER 658 3916
_________ Wual of W ayrm ’l  86 on E att M ain__________

FOR ALL TYPES OF Mason 
arc work -coucrete. stucco, 
plaster, curbs, underpinning, 
pumphouses, see C l  Burt 
Estimates Free 658-3614 
8 8 kp

FOB YOl B BEST DEAL on
automatic or side rolling 
vprinkler systems, check first 
with Buddv Angle (817( 
658-3142 or 658-3327 nights 
3-77 ,t

NEED SHEAFEER SKHIP 
INK? We have Deluie Blue or 
Jet Black 2 fl oi.. 39 cents. 
The Knox Counts New v ifnc

WATER w e u  d r il l in g .
irrigation l ib  ft . domestic 18 
fl Call W P Hise (817) 8tv4 
3727 Haskell_________ 8-7 tfc

WANTED • Beautician In 
quire al Mini Mall ur call 
658-3957 8-7 lie

NU IIUE tttrctrve imme 
diatelv. The Dairy Mart will 
be closed even Thursday. 
8-7 |tc

MEMOS t  C A R P tl paths and
spots Fluff beaten down nap 
with Blue Lustre Rent elec­
tric yhampooer 11 C ity Hard 
ware 8 '  1(1

CARD OF THANKS
We want to thank everyone 

for the flowers, food and other 
acts of kindness shown us 
dunng our recent bereave­
ment

Your thoughtfulness will 
always be remembered

The family of 
Mrs Lucilc Weatherall 

6 6 Itc____________________

CARD OF THANKS
I would like to take this 

means of expressing mt sin­
cere thanks to friends who 
have donated money, clothes, 
diapers, as well as money for 
postage to send supplies to 
the Res and Mrs Duwood 
Stew an in Recife. Brazil 

The Strwans need these 
item* for a nursery for aban 
doned children

Your generosity is deeply 
appreciated

Orelle Stephens
8-7 | tc ________

(A R D  OF THANKS
We would like to thank 

everyone for their help and 
consideration dunng Lynn's 
illness W> are especially 
grateful to the men who 
plowed for us and all the 
people who donated blood 
We deeply appreciate all the 
visits, cards, and phone calls 
we have had

Until we get i  chance to 
thank everyone personally, 
we want you to know we 
appreciate all the concern 

Lynn and C athy Holmes 
8-7 Itp

Let Scale Farm ftnmxce yowl 
new car for 6% inctwAng 
tervtrr Ufa lawurware A Free 
Lfcvwar Tags fur term erf loan

LOOK 
;$> WHO’S 

HERE!

Both pasture land and crop land 
qualify for a Federal Land Bank loan 
if properly managed Remember 
that the Land Bank Association 
located right in your area is familiar 
with local conditions and loc al 
needs - and will do everything possibk 
to provide a long term loan at 
reasonable cost

We can provide s o u n d  
financing to fit you r 
sou n d  m anagem ent.

federal land bank
ASSOCIATION OF HASKELL

JOC HARPER

^NRces el Flaxkrll knvm . and Seymour 
MA5KF1I  ( F I I P H t l M  8M ?0h2 

ANSON IF 11 PFIONF 821 | |4j 
Long nme loan* on farm* ,n<d ranch* * m

— — U l i _________

Mr and Mrs Ray Ethe 
redge of Lubbock are the 
proud parents of a babv boy 
born August 5 at I I  19 p m 
in St Mary's of the Plains 
Hospital in Lubbock 

The baby has been named 
lew Matthew and weighed 
seven pounds I I  ounces 

Grandparents are Mr and 
Mr* Clifford Cornett of Knox 
( itv and Mr and Mrs W B 
Eiheredgr of Hugo, Okla 
homa.

Great grandparents are
Mr and Mrs. Roy Carver and 
Mr* W H Cornell, all of 
Knot Citv

Lei Scat* Farm write vour
Home Owners at a devvatsoc
of 20*5

Let Stale Farm help you
with o u r savings plan. Lr-a- 
K ro g b o rT S A  with flexible
premiums

Insure vour crops with the 
leading Insurance Camet in 
lesas

Nationwide Crop Hail 
the best cotton policy on 

the market adjusted on indict 
dual stalk count, will be in full 
effect June 19 LEO FCTSCR, 
422-4259 In Mnadav 6-19 tfc

(  ARD OF THANKS
I want to thank each and 

even one who sent me cards 
and letters while I was in the 
hospital: for all of the kind 
deeds of visits, food and 
donations to my family Since 
I will be in a wheelchair 
another month or so. why not 
come again1

Thanks again and God
bless you

John and Barbara Averin 
Paula Rhonda 

Lisa and John Jr
8-7 Itp

I  XCITING  NF VS VS AY
paint* An lips - convert a 
tube ol paint into a unique 
panning i *<l K iw i < uunlv 
News. *x!*c

LOOK
W HO’S
HERE!

PATIENTS DISMISSED 
SINCE JULY 26. 1975 
Knox City: Bertha Lucille 
Weatherall (Deceased). Rosa 
lind Ray. Christy Shiflett 
•m *» : Joyce Greenwood.
Karen Grisham 
(Juanah John Pvles 
Mundav: Ella Mae Wallace. 
Brenion Wallace. Babv Bov 
Wallace (Deceased)
Tntax-ott: Sidney Burtivn 
Rochester Leon arc Rrvna

Oscar’s TV Service
We will do our best to 

fix any brand T.V. Bring 
it to the shop and 
we1 II give Ha try.

2 0 %  on all 8-Track
Off Auto Tape Players

F■ rsTquanTy name brand 
8-Track Tapes 

at discount prices

Notice
That in accordance with arti­
cle I3 ''c  of I he Penal Code 
CRIMINAL IRESPASS tSen 
aie Bill III passed by the 62nd 
legislature!, notice it hereby 
given that all lands of thr 
vs T Waggoner Estate are 
POStED save and esxepl 
•  hen- written permission is 
given to come upon the same 
JOHN BIGGS. TRUSTEE. 
12-2 tfc

PL BLK NOTICE

Carnrv Independent School 
District of O ’Bnea will hold a 
public heanng concenimg the 
1975-76 school budget Mon 
day night. August I I .  1975. al 
8 00 o'clock in the supenn 
(endent's office at the O'Bn 
en School 8-7 lie

Mr and Mrs Delbert Rav 
Haves of Sevmour announce 
the birth of a daughter. Misti 
Ann. July J. in the Sevmour 
Hospital

She weighed eight pounds.
two ounces

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs Delbert Hayes of O'Bn 
en and Mr and Mrs Clarence 
Studrr of Seymour 

Great grandparents are 
Mr and Mrs Virgil Tate .4 
Yale. Oklahoma, and Mrs. 
Lola Walls of Seymour

Hospital
News

PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL 
AUGUST 2. 1975 
Knoi City: Manurla Dc Los 
Rios Alfred Eddington. Em 
ma J Jones Raymond White. 
I  V Dodd
O'Brien: Clifton Duncan 
Rochester: Paul Melton 
Rule: Debbie Tanner and
Bel Girl H l Riggin* 
Monday: Mary Ann Cunning 
ham Pauline Morrow. Flo­
rence Gaines 
Benjamin: K 1) Benson 

>: Karen Grisham

N e w s  N o tes  
iro m  th e

Brazos Valiev Care Home
if

(
by

MRS EDNA E l HANK
tvnn Glasscock nephew of 

Joe was here from E*rlh  to 
see his uncle

Mr Waldnp entertained 
several of his friends and 
relatives Iasi week Tommie 
Cox of Oklahoma Citv called 
on him James and Rhuev 
Dutton of Earth came Rhuev 
is a daughter Margaret Ann 
Hill and girls of Mundav 
called

Mamie Benton welcitmed 
as her guest Mrs West of 
O 'Bnrn

Tommie Cox of Oklahoma 
City and Fkirene Reese visit-

STREAMS IN 
IDESERT PLACES

by 0 l6 l l9  Stephens

LEGA1 NOTICE

The Knox City LS D will 
.onduct a public budget hear 
ng for 1975-78 uhool year. 
The hearing will be held in 
•he Board Room of Knox City 
High School. August 19. al 8 
) .« .

John L. Grindstaff Jr. 
Board Secretary

1-7 He
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iheJEditori
July 29 I97S

Dear Billye.
Wanted you to know about 

oxr vacation Rene and Jennie 
cime dow n and picked me up 
cm July 20 We went to Austin 
j i Sunday and stayed three 
cays While there we visited 
r>e Capitol. L B.J. Library 
aid other points of interest 
Then on to San Marcos where 
•e saw an underwater boat 
siow Then to San Antonio foe 
tkree days and there we took 
anver tide in the daytime and 
4 so a night lour down the 
nver We ate lunch upon the 
Tower of the Americas which 
wax 525 fret high We took 
lours of the missions, the 
Governors Palace. Buckhom 
Saloon. Lone Star Brewery, 
a hu h served root beer or real 
beer, an galleries, curio 
shops, and of course, the 
Alamo All were very interest­
ing. colorful, and beautiful.

On Sunday, the 29th. we 
came to Corpus We have 
been out on the bay in the 
Gulf Clipper for a one hour 
tour, which seemed much 
longer Saw ihe biggest Naval 
Station in the USA. and the 
oldest gas well off shore, 
seperating the refinery out in 
the Bay.

Sea gulls followed us out on 
the tour boat We would feed 
them cheese ensps and they 
would fly down and take them 
from your fingers.

We plan to dnve to Padre 
Island tomorrow, which will 
be the 30th Then back to 
Gatesvillr Saturday.

Rene and Jennie will go on 
into Lubbock Sunday.

Notice no one told you 
Rene. Jrnnie and I were in 
Knox City for Pa's birthday. 
Easter Sunday, then back in 
Knox City for the homecom- 
mg

Love to get your paper each 
week Real proud of your 
girls Have had a wonderful 
time with Rene and Jennie 

Love to all of Knox City 
friends say 'hi' to Bea.

Annie Dowding

Pal O Rilrv 
2318 N Pacific 

Santa Ana. California 927(36 
Dear Billye Bess.

We look forward to getting 
the paper every week Think 
you're doing a very good job 

Congratulations on your 
daughters both of them teem 
to be so talented'

We plan to be home in 
August if possible Maybe 
we'll sec you

Love.
Jean Me Auley Riley

Fayetteville. Arkansav 
August I. 1975 

Dear Billsr Bess.
I want to say thank you for 

the nice obituary on Mrs 
Beatrice Pope E^ell I wanted 

| an much to have it in the Knox 
City paper She loved Knox 

I City and spent many years 
there Best Wishes

Sincerely. 
Rosa Wlfsxm

" I f  ye abide in me. anxl my 
words abide in ye. ye shall ask 
what ye will, and it shall he 
done unto you." (John 15:7.)

God does answer all pray­
ers if you abide . Him and 
His Word abides in you The 
Bible is filled with answered 
prayers The answer may not 
come as you expect hut you 
are commanded to pray and 
God has promised to answer 
in H it own way

There are two requirements 
for answered prayer in our 
scripture First vou are to 
abide in Him or remain in His 
perfect will at all cost (Rom 
12:1-2) Second His Word is 
to abide in you: they are to 
become a vital pan of your 
life You are to be filled with 
His spint. guided by His 
Word When you meet these 
requirements your prayers 
will be answered, your life 
will he filled with joy and 
peace, all fear will melt away. 
You will be empowered w ith a 
special sustaining strength 
you will be able to share with 
others the glorious truths of 
God. which will help you to 
have more joy. peace and 
happiness streaming into 
your being and into all of vour 
life.

6*1 Mrs King She also g,rr. 
rd Mrs Bovd and Mrc Fir , 
of Kuos City and Mi <n̂  
Mrs Buddv < all and 
grandsons of Waurik. (* ( , 
homa

Mrs M E Strickland g| 
Mundav was in lo xcr (\,n 
Elliott

Mrs Griffith spent an ex 
lovable dav with her vox
Sipe. and Dosle

Joe Glasscock hinted Mr 
Gaines of Mundav 

Grandma Acrrr and daugh 
ter in law called on Mr Wal 
drip They are from Rmhes 
ter

Mrs Hcttle and Eunice 
Michaels of Rochester were 
visitors of M t and Mrs Kav 

Ralph Rav. wife and two 
children came by on their 
to Olton to see his parents On 
thru return thrv also stopped 
a while Thev're from Marble 
Falls

Mr Hardin, a new guest at 
the home, spends htv mghtv 
in the home and hiv davs at 
his own home,

Mrs Pam Duke id Bcn|. 
min was a visitor of Joe 
Glasscock

Lvnn Waldnp accompanied 
by his wife, two daughters, 
and their children of Odessa 
was welcomed bv Mr Wal 
drip His daughter. Bern 
Henderson, has a win. Pete, 
and Mrs P«-KK' Rlrdv** has 
f * in v  Terri and Sherri 

Birthday* include August 
9. Minnie Solomon and Fran 
ct\ Vaughn. August 14. Ber 
tha Reeves. August 22. John 
Pvies. August 2b. Ida King. 
August 30. Thelma Mu Auley.
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HOW SWEET IT IS
Watermelon Summertime Kids 

ade The kids, how fast they grow 

soon are college age Now, while 

young is the time to start a college 

them so when their lazy hazy days 0 ! 

are over they'll have the money la ­

goon to college and you'll have Y°ur

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK

" C • INSCPr S
n o  a w i;y



A ugust

ip Five Guar 
Counties

Despite the many problem* 
associated with 1974, Texas 
farmers were able to produce 
more than 25 million pounds 
of guar beans--a three million 
pound increase from 1973 

Complete figures on all 
Texas field crop* have been 
W f M  in the ” 1974 Texas 

Field Crop Statistics " Copies 
may be obtained by writing 
John C. White, Commission­
er. Texas Department of Agri­
culture. P .0 . Box 12H47, Aus­
tin, Texas 78711.

RETURN FROM TRIP
Mrs Harel Long and Mrs. 

Mary Vaughan returned 
home Wednesday from a 
three-week trip to the Pacific 
Coast with the Traveling Tex­
ans. They were met in Abi­
lene by Mrs Vaughan's 
niece, Mrs. Fuller Shannon 
and Mrs. Kenneth Lankford.

While in California, the 
women visited Mrs Vaugh­
an's nephews. Atson Reeder 
of Eureka Springs, and Mr 
and Mrs. Patrick Shannon of 
San Francisco. Also M r and 
Mrs. W M. Reeder of Los 
Angeles and Mrs. Allison 
Reeder of Laguna Beach.

M is. Louise Kemletr serv­
ed as tour director for the 
group, and is due home this 
week from Dallas This was 
the second tour Mrs Kemlet/ 
has directed this summer for 
the Dallas agency.

LLES

VISITING HERE
Seaman 3rd Class Mike 

Pridgen, grandson of Mr and 
Mrs. A P Denton, is visiting 
several days with them. He is 
on his wav to Norfolk. Virgi­
nia. w here he will be aboard a 
submarine in the Atlantic 
Ocean.

Other visitors over the 
weekend were Miss Lou Den­
ton, Danny and Donny Den­
ton. sons of M r. and Mrs. 
David Denton of Arlington 
and Mrs Lois Bruton and 
Randy of Olney.

IN LUBBOCK
Mrs Roy Day Sr. Dana 

Day. Mrs. Jack Stubbs. Sandy 
and Shea were in Lubbock 
over the weekend to visit 
relatives and to bring Darin 
Day home with them.

Darin has been visiting Mr 
and Mrs. Clyde Day.

>W MANY YEARS 
'ILL YOU LIVE?

alble to live a much longer life, 
ilcetioua disease can be con - 
i draft Even the few Incurs - 

If the diagnosis la early.
I secure expert treatment be- 

i rsrsf* your body. Consult your 
bertaalug of physical diaeom- 

tncdicsUon pr worthed Follow 
sod you Increase the odds 

user, more slckneus-free life.

many peo ple  ENTRUST 1'8
health needs and ether 

acts. We consider this trust a 
duly. May v « be your personal 

eyr

JONES
iRMACY IN C.

p r i n c i p a l

(from  page one)

attend a fourth quarter, nor 
•re teachers required to teach 
more than three quarters.

Local districts can offer i  
traditional summer school If 
they wish

Eligibility for funding un­
der the Foundation School 
Program is based on student 
attendance for 180 days, three 
quarters, in one school year.

District* must offer a full 
complement of required cour­
ses in order to obtain state 
financing in any quarter.

The three quarters that a 
student will be counted for 
eligible ADA must be deter­
mined by the district when a 
student begins a school year.

Districts will continue to 
arrange the school calendar 
for holidays, vacations, and 
inservice education.

Requirements for teaheer 
certification will remain un­
changed.

Districts will continue to 
make all contract arrange­
ments as to length of service 
for employment of school
personnel.

Students still must be five 
years old by September I to 
be eligible to enter public 

a*chool* for the first lime.
Local districts will be re­

quired to develop policies so 
that students who transfer or 
miss a quarter because of 
illness can fit into the nest 
quarter without losing credit.

Districts arc given the op­
tion of selecting a plan for 
granting credit. One plan 
provides for 80 minute classes 
each day for t*0 days a total of 
80 hours of instruction for 
»nr-half credit. Under ano­
ther plan, one quarter unit of 
credit is earned in 55 minute 
classes for bO days for a total 
of 55 clock hours of instruc­
tion. Under either plan, the 
school year still totals 180 
days.

Moving to the quarter sys­
tem may have little effect 
upon the administrative ope­
ration of Elementary Schools 
provided a school operates 
only three quarters Our Ele­
mentary School will maintain 
a balanced curriculum offer­
ing In three quarters English 
language arts, science, math­
ematics. social studies, art, 
creative dramatics. music, 
health, and physical educa 
lion. Each course based 
upon the state description of 
courses and local courses of 
study.

The quarter system in the 
secondary school operation 
will still be in accordance with 
accreditation standards and 
wil specify time allocations for 
most subjects from grades 
7-12. The time allocations will 
differ very slightly in the 
quarter system from those in 
the semester plan.

Knot City school officials 
feel that local needs could 
best be met by using the 55 
minute period class operated 
on a three twelve weeks 
period. Together the three 
twelve weeks periods must 
include 180 days of student 
instruction excluding teach­
ers' workdays or holidays. 
Report cards will be sent out 
on a twelve week basis along 
with mailing out unsatisfac­
tory cards every three weeks. 
We will not be using the term 
semester anymore, but will be 
using first, second or third 
quarter. The student's grades 
will be determined by how 
well he does in at v one 
quarter- each quarter will he 
graded by itself--each quarter 
will stand on its own

In the past it has taken a 
student 20 credits to gradu­
ate. providing they were the 
required credits In the future 
the requirements will be (s0 
quarters of specific subjects. 
In Kno* Citv. most of the

LOOK,
HOMEOWNERS

having paint problems and are considering doing 
3 about it, check into the United States Steel siding 

Nation.
,rom 7 beautiful colors. Save $25 to $50 a square.

your problems at one time including windows and 
r®* estimates, including installation. Call

r- "Dutch’ Benson Construction
l T«*at Phone S17 454-2281 alter 5 p f

1975 KNOX COUNTY 

Band Rehearsals 
To Begin Aug. 11

Band practice will begin 
Monday, August 11. at 9:00 
a m. and all band students 
wishing to participate in the 
marching band thia year must 
be present, according to H u ­
bert Seale. Knos City band 
director

Mr Seale asks that all 
prospective band students in 
grades 8 through 12 attend 
these practice sessions He 
said that if there are any 
questions pertaining to the 
Knox City band programs, 
readers may call him at 
6S8-3781.

NEW S PAG E T H R E E
IN LUBBOCK

M r and Mrs Parker Den
ton were in Lubbock over the 
weekend where Opal attend 
ed the showing of fall and 
winter hairstyles at Jeaaie 
Lee's Hair Design Institute.

They were also weekend 
guests in the home of their 
daughter and her family. Mr. 
and Mrs William Allred and 
Mandy

YARD OF THE M O N TH  for August has boon chosen by the Knox C ity Garden  
Club com m ittee Honors w en tto  M r and M rs  Lee Roy (Boots) W alker, who live 
at 1005 South Third Street The com m ittee m ade its selection on the basis of the 
neat, trim  shrubs, flowers and blooming trees

FROM MERTZON
M r. and Mrs Wayne Ha 

ney and Jennifer of Meruun  
were here to attend the 
funeral services for Mrs 
Lucille Weatherall last Wed 
nesday

They also visited Mrs 
Carrie Belle Benedict

subjects will be three quarter 
subjects w ith ■ few one or two 
quarter subjects offered. Re­
quired subjects will be eaactly 
the same as in the past with 
the exception of quarter cre­
dits rather than semester 
credits

M r Holcomb concluded. 
"This article has just touched 
the surface of the quarter 
system, but I feel certain that 
in time this new system will 
be no more complicated than 
the semester unit plan Wc 
are in a continuous move to 
improve education for our 
children and this new pro­
gram certainly seems to be a 
step forward."

SOLVE 
IT ONCE 

AND FOR 
ALL WITH 

A JACUZZ 
SUBMERSIBLE

If enough water is your 
problem . . here's your 
long term answer’ A Ja 
cu/./i submersible that will 
give you lop perfurmaniv 
in your well for years on 
end. Installed and serviced 
»y Lynn Electric

all Lvnn Electric now 
We've got the pump to 
solve your water problem 
once and for all

LYNN ELECTRIC  
MOTOR CO INC

Knoa City, Taxat 
8M  3611

KNOX CITY INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
School ( air Ildar 1975-76

August 18 and 21 School In-Service
August 19 and 20 Co-op In Service
August 22 First Dav of School
September 1 Labor Day
November 7 Divt IS ! A, Knox Co
November 14 End 1st (Juarter
November 17 Teacher Workday
November 27-28 Thanksgiving Holidays
Dec. 22-Jan 4 t  hristmav Holidays
February 25 End 2nd (Juancr
February 2b Teacher Workday
February 27 In-Service
April 15 n-Service
April 16 20 Faster Holidays
Mav 28 End trd Quarter
Mav 29 Teacher Workday

Bearings, Bearings,

Church School"—-——— — -— —  IOiW

Morning W orshlp...... — — ——  11.00

E veniag W orship................... —  8:00

J A M E S  P P A T T E R S O N . Pastor

( lin iU d M itfio c iis t Cfiuxcfi

c o f  c
F r o m  P an t' < )ne

Rural Development scheduled 
at Texas AAM in November 
Baker made the motion that 
the necessary expense be 
taken care of by the Chamber 
and Wright seconded the 
motion.

A proposal was also made 
that Knox City plan a musical 
jamboree some Saturday 
night such as those that are 
being enjoyed by our neigh­
boring towns A night will be 
selected so as not to comflict 
with other jamborees and the 
date. time, and program will 
be made public in the near 
future

In other dlscitsmon . Mrs 
Crownover reported that the 
housing study is continuing 
and that Joe Bill Pierce, 
architect, consulted with offi­
cials here last week

Mention was alto made in 
regard to the Senior Texas 
Employment Program that is 
bring expanded to include 
Knox County. As will be 
noted elsewhere in this 
week's News, workers 55 
years of age who fall within 
income restnettons are eligi­
ble for the program and 
applicants will be interviewed 
here Tuesday, August 12, 
from 2:00 until 5:00 p.m in 
the school administration 
building.

WATER 
PROBLEM?

Bearings!
TRACTORS-PLOWS-COMBINES

SWEEPS-CHISELS-CULTIVATORS

DUCKFOOT-SPIKES

BELTS [ALL SIZES]

TRACTOR & AUTOMOTIVE 
REPAIR PARTS

Egenbacher Implement
Knox City100 Central 6S8 3242

ANTIQUE
AUCTION

Saturday, August 9 
Starting at 1:00 P .M .
On sale will be our 
personally selected 

Early American 
Furniture, Primitives, 

Glassware, Wicker and 
Other Collectibles

Stovall’s Antiques
Old Kimbell Grocery Warehouse 

Anson Highway-Opposite REA Office 
STAMFORD, TEXAS

SUPPLIES FOR THE OFFICE
EATONS CORRASABLE" 

BOND TYPE PAPER

1

*>» v , r  ^•> A £  ̂I*

EATON'S CORRASABLE
t y p e w r it e r  p a p e r

FLAIR HARD HEAD

MANILA FOLDERS

S TA P LE !

A b o n d e d  pap**> w ith  am axm g 
• ra s in g  q u a litie s  T yp ew ritte n  
w o rk  e rases ea s ily  and  c taa rty  
w ith  p e n c il e raser

100 Sheets to Packet

S C e 'B B L E 'T t*
DESK PAD Now Flair Hard Head

available in four VIV10 cotnra 

Biua Green Black and Red

I f G A l  FADS AUTOOEX GALAXIE 
LIST FINDER

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS
656-3142 K n«i\ l  itv
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Truscott -  Gilliland 
News
by Jim Cumlev

COMMUNITY EVENTS
The August Truscott J»m 

borre was a tremendous suc- 
te n  Over 400 people cam* to 
' iten to the sw inging country 
music The nest musical, 
dubbed "Country Town. Sat­
urday Night” , will be August 
JO Everybody come and have 
some fun!

If you've driven through 
Truscott lately you've proba 
blv seen people busy paint­
ing. building, and filing up 
their houses The end result is 
personal enjoyment but it's 
also a big step in putting 
Truscott in first place at the 
community contest neit time 
The judges want to see a 
change so everyone keep 
bust! (PS.. The lop prue is 
SI00!)

The residents of Gilliland 
would like to invite everyone 
to the Gilliland school build­
ing every Friday night. Vol­
leyball. basketball, pool, and 
various card games are exam- 
pies of the exciting things 
happening in this fun loving 
community Why sit home 
and watch a dull movie? 
Come to Gilliland for a fun- 
filled evening!
AROl'ND TOWN

Mrs E.J. Jones visited 
Mrs Bvron Bates and Mrs 
Irene Gerrold in (Juanah. 
Friday

James Arnold of Spur visit 
ed with Mr and Mrs W K 
Owens here, Tuesday Thurs­
day. Mrs Owens visited Mrs. 
Solomon in the Knoi City rest 
home

Mrs Louis Batv attended 
the baby shower for Jana 
Lope; in Crowell last week 
end _____

Mr Furl Burgess is pre 
senlty in the Ouanah hospital 

The large gathering in the 
home of Mrs. Venta Horne 
included M r and Mrs F H 
Carter of Grandbury . J D 
Horne of Oklahoma City. Ok 
lahoma. Bonnie Coltharp of 
Sevmour. Mr and Mrs. Pete 
Ellis of Andrews. Mrs Joyce 
Holder of Fort Worth. Mrs 
Faye Mitchell of Dallas, and 
Mr and Mrs A.E Propps of 
the t>bbt> Ranch

Visitors of Mr and Mrs 
O R  Miller this weekend 
were Mr. and Mrs Jacku- 
Miller of Munday

Mrs Be r niece Davis is 
visiting in Rule and attending 
a high school reunion in 
Haskell all this week 

Guests in the Elmo Shaw 
home this weekend were Mr 
and Mrs. Jim Shook

Wednesday to Friday. Mr 
and Mrs Lloyd Heard visited 
the Jem  Anderson familv in 
Pemton. On the way back, 
they visited in Roaring 
Springs.

Richard Westbrook spent 
the night with Randy Foster 
in Crowell. Monday 

Visiting Mrs H P Gillespie 
Saturday was Mrs. Hubert 
Chowning of Seymour 

Jana and Anna Aleiander 
are spending the week in the 
Sydney Alexander home 

Mines Tom Westbrook. 
Sails Toileson. and Cora Ttsl- 
leson of Ouahah visited Mr 
and Mrs Edwin Toileson in 
Grand Saline Tuesday- 
through Friday.

Visitors in the Paul Horne 
home this weekend were Mrs 
Paula Smith and von of Hous­
ton ______________________

J L Batv visiied Mrs. Ray 
Batv over the weekend 

Guests ol Mt and Mrs 
1 harles Burton ihrough the 
weekend were Mrs Alan 
Robinson and children of 
Matador

Mi and Mrs Ronnie Sim
m>-ns and c hildren v ivhed Mr 
and Mrs Jerry Jeton and 
daughter m Dallas last week 

Bob Havme of Wichita 
Falls spent Saturday with Mr 
and Miv W H Havme 

Visiting Mr and Mrs Cur 
tis Casrv this weekend were 
Rev Claude Hams and son 
and Mark I.ynce. all of East 
land Rev Harris delivered 
the sermon at the Truscott 
Baptist Church this Sunday 

Mr Harrold Baird died 
Wednesday in Mundav Mr 
Baird, a former Gilliland rest 
dent, will be buned in the 
Gilliland cemetary.

‘Ma Eiland’ 
Dies July 21

W ord has been received by 
friends here of the death of 
"M a Eiland" Moorhousc. ft7, 
who died in Galveston July 
21 Services and burial were 
held in Galveston on Juls 23

Born Exie Rosser in Ala­
bama she moved to Mundav 
in 1‘JOtv and in tuu mimed  
David Ansel Filand Mr El- 
land died in l*»J2.

At one time she operated 
the Eiland Hotel and later 
began working for her son. 
the late Dr D C Eiland in his 
offices in Mundav where she 
remained front 14.14 to 1‘fcvX 
when her grandson. Dr D C 
Eiland Jr. closed the offices in 
Mundav and moved to Gal 
veston

She was married to Charles 
Moorhouse in 1452 He died 
in February. I4?5.

Ma Eiland" wav honored 
bv Munday and Knoi City 
doctors in 1454 for her 20 
years of service to the medical 
profession and received a 
large portrait of hervelf av a 
vurpnve gift.

Due to failing health, she 
moved to Galveston in |4t»ft to 
be near her eldest daughter. 
Mrs B F Hood

Survivors include a son, 
Andv Eiland of Galveston, 
tw daughters. Mrs Hood 
and Mis Laserne Martin of 
Milwaukee, Wisconsin, nine 
grandchildren and twelve 
greatgrandchildren

IN COLORADO
Mr and Mrs Bill Anderson

and Dav id returned home last 
weekend from a two week 
vacation in South Fork and 
Creede. Colorado.

Remember When

Maurice Dale Graham, son 
of M . and Mrs l W Graham
,» home on a *> <»-y 
from duties in the Navy !>»'* 
,s a tadioman and ha* been 
aboard the SS Abram ^  
Hewitt He is the youngest of 
four Graham brothers tn the 
w r\ le t

C pi Kenneth M>er» ,x 
home on JO dav furlough w«h 
h,s wife Pauline and his 
parents Mr and Mrs Roc 
Mvcrs of Sunset Cpl Msers 
has just returned from a 14 
month tour of Europe 

Jl'NF 14. 1445
Paul Hoge recently wrote 

h,s parents Mr and Mrs 
C t  Hoge. that his ship, the 
Comfort, and a destroyer 
were -pen to the public last 
Sunday and 250.000 people 
viewed the recent damage to 
the ships tins was to impress 
the publi- how badlv the Navv 
needed ship repairmen of all 
kinds

APKII 26- 1445 
V.F . Da> I  lowing
Plan* Announced

With V E Dav |u*t around
the comer in the war again*! 
G rmaay Kn.«» i  m  will oh 
svrvc the momentous occa- 
sitwi with a business holiday 
and many lorms of thanksgiv 
ing and celebration The fol 
lowing vhedule was worked 
out for merchants
1 Immediate closing for the 

remainder of the day if
word comes before I p m.
2 Immediate closing for that 

and all of neit day it word
comes after I p m.
J II word comes at any hour 
on Saturday or Sunday, will 

close all dav Mondavi

MAY 23. I **JO
The American Legion i» 

planning a two day picnic to 
be given in Knoi City on Julv 
4 and 5 Watch the Herald for 
further information.

Jl NF 2. I4M»
Cars are crossing the rivet 

now just abosr the bridge, 
between Knox City and Ben­
jamin You can make it so 
don't make the trip around 
Work has been started on 
repairing the bridge and word 
is received that it will be 
i omplcted in about three 
wcekv

We deal with 
two types o f energy:
I. HUMAN

Mans businesses and industries 
.ire moving info this region from 
other purls of the counlrs Thc\ vc 
found that wc have a willing work 
force, a sensible tax structure, 
favorable weather and adequate 
energy sources

New industries don't just move 
into ytvur town by accident 
Sometimes years of personal 
contacts by your Chamber of 
Commerce industrial team and the 
industrial development experts at 
Lone Star Gas arc carried on before 
the final decision is reached to 
relocate in your town

Your Chamber's industrial team, 
aided by the state, county and 
utility teams, study the area to make 
sure the right industry is matched 
with the right plant site location 

A new business or industry helps 
your town s economy by providing 
new |obs and by adding tax dollars 
for schools and hospitals and other 
community services

So when you hear about a new 
industry moving into your town, 
call your Chamber of Commerce 
and thank them for another |oh 
well done

2. N \l l R \L
To our customers, l.one Star is 

"the gas company We serve over 
one million customers in about 400 
cities and towns in Texas That's a 
lot of customers and a lot of 
responsibility People depend on 
Lone Star Gas to have the available 
natural gas energy whenever and 
wherever they need it And we've 
provided that energy for over h0  
years through investments in 
pipelines, compressor stations and 
the purchase of new. more 
expensive gas supplies

Natural gas produced in the 
United States provides over 
O N I H A LF of this country's 
industrial energy requirements And 
the availability of adequate natural 
gas energy is one of the primary 
reasons that more and more 
businesses and industries arc 
moving into this part of (he country

Ijonc Star Gas is committed to 
helping your town attract ami keep 
industries that can provide |ohs ami 
help the economy It's |ust good 
business tor all of us

A  Lone Star Gas
I hr clean energy company

M r* W E. Benedict and 
Mrs Joe Avertti vtilled in 
Stamford Friday of tail week 

Mrv Browning and Lon 
nance left la*t week for 
Canton where they arc to 
spend the summer

M r* Stubbs tv carrying ihe 
mail this week for her bus 
band who i* laking hit van  
non.

Jl'NE 13. 14JO 
Special* far Friday 
Sad Salurdav

Finger and water wave* 15 
cents M r*. Curtis Wilco* in 
Oliver home

W ANTED
500 caves of eggs al I ’  

.cm* a dozen Porter and 
Wh.tr

Iv i m i  Whu Downtown
Mrv Dave Whilford is a 

ladv » ho sells drs goods She 
is probable better known as 
Wilma and her place of sales 
is Maloufs.

Mrv Wall is Iwe almost 
said ihicf clerk) al Wall's Drv 
Goods and Variety Store but 
»c know this is rmvncous for 
ill. M itt Slargarel Ann W’all 

iv not .ml* chief clerk hut boss 
of it all.

Mrs. Cecil Coates is none 
liter than Belts and she not 
nlv knows what vou cat but 

H .vs vou eat it She works at 
the Sanitary Cafe with her 
husband

Sir* C H Keck it another 
>1 those women who knows 
\ >u hate pudding for dinner 
or whether or not you even 
have dinner She veils grocer­
ies at Edwards Self Service 
Grocery

MAY 10. I4J0
Martha Jane Jones. 1444 

graduate made (he A C.C. 
honor roll making a grade of 

Superior" in three subjects

The fourth annual birthday 
pans of the Methodist Wo­
men’s S.Kietv of Christian 
Sees ice will have a tea on 
October fourth from three to 
foe in the home of Mrs J A 
Wilton A silver offering will 
h< taken

Jl NF 21. 1445 
I m o l  Piwl Office Lo ( jo 
Sc-iond ( la** on Julv 1*1;
R<.d p i*  Doubled 
Four Years

Announcement of the up­
ward change in rating was 
received early this week by 
Pivsimaiter B.L Anderson. 
m  \ i  in. h m  
Notice

On account of increased 
work it will be necessary to 
Jivontinuc the custom of 
c .reeling water and sewer 
bit's on the streets therefore 
on and atlel tune I.  I4J0 all 
water and sewer bills will be 
>tu and payable al ihe City 
Secrvlarv '* oHWc in Ihe City 
Ha.I on or before ihe 10th of 
iht month

I- B Denton 
Mayor

Jl NF 14. I44S
On June J. 1445 the fifth 

annual Alumini meeting was 
held A number of e i gradu 
au s and friends were there 
fix the morning service and 
lunch

Ihe following officer* were 
etc* ted for ihe coming year 
President Mrs Mabel Pvratt 
Vue President Ancrl Waldrip 
Recording Secretary Mrv 

Ruhv Melton
t .^responding Secretary • 

Mrv Buddv Angle 
Treasurer Mrs loycc league 
Fiecuiive committee Sam 

mte Carpenter, Henry 
Jones Prte Whitten. Jess 
Hitchcock. Bess Smith

A L G IS T  21. 1445 
C harles l  R.,r Kmn

t  ity and a graduate of North 
Texas State College was ap 
pointed United Slates Vice 
< <m»ul and wdl assume hi* 
duties in i  uidad ( hihuaha 
M r.ico  on September 10

FROM HAMLIN
Mr and Mrs Jimmv 

Skiles. Sco*ty. K m tie . and 
Timmy of Hamlin visited her 
parent*. Mr and M r* Doug
Mem/er and Tvke recently

VRJC Sets 
Registration 
August 27-28

Rcgivtralion for Ihe Fall 
semester *t Vernon Regional 
Junior College will be held 
Auguvt 2? and 2ft in the 
Student llnion Building at the 
VKJC campus

Students whose last name 
begins A through J will 
register on August 27 w ith the 
remainder registering on Au­
gust 2H Registration times 
are ft *0 a m until 12 TO p m  
and 4 10 p m until ft K) p m 
each day.

All students desiring pre 
registration counseling and 
schedule advising m*v come 
to the Student Service* office 
on the VRJL campus an* time 
from ft 00 a m until 5 00 p m 
August 4 15 Orientation for 
new students will be held in 
the Student Llnion Building at 
4 JO a m August 2b

L lasses tor the fall semes 
ter will begin September 2 
w ith September 4 the last day 
for laic registration.

IN CROW NOV FH IIO M F
Mrs Mike Collinswortb of. 

Plano, who has spent the 
summer in Can m complet­
ing her master's degree, and 
Scott and Stephanie Smith of 
Canyon arrived in Knox City 
Iasi week for a visit with Mrs 
Collinsworth's parents. Mt 
and Mrs John Crow noser

M r Collmsworth met his 
wife here and the group 
attended the wedding of his 
sister. Laths, in Abilene Sat 
urday night before the Col- 
linvw sorths returned home to 
Plano

Scott and Stephanie 
remained for *  week's visit 
with their grandparents

COACH ML It II A M  Y 
ATTENDS SCHOOL

Coach Steve Mclthaney, 
girl's basketball coach, at­
tended Coaching School in 
Brownwood. Julv 10. I I .  and 
12.

IN W A I l HOME
Visiting with Mr and Mrs 

H E Wall this week were 
their grandchildren. Robert, 
Sheri and Shelly Wall of 
Rotan.

IN  UVALDE
M r and M rs Eddie Shaver 

are spending this week i* 
Uvalde with their son xnd ha 
wife. M r and Mrs Brtct 
Shaver. They arc *lv> gettiaj 
acquainted with their new 
grandson Bruton Thorn**

W EEKEND GUEST
A weekend guest .4 Mt 

and M rs Buddv Tankrr*iev 
and Mrs Minnie Pool >u  
Virginia Eakman »4 Chico

♦  OIL FIELD »  INDUSTh
W IR IN G IRRIGATION

& C El
KneaChf I

Rochester Dry
SAT., AUG. 9. 1C

t m m f i f n f 11 in i o i i{
la.;..! In- l  l. .ir M ' I 
I, < Ma, him W .v  . |
4 Drink Coca Cola Mad 
\ \  Hood Multimner Sha
t . M..k ' -I
Registers. J Adding Machinal 
Desks, IMG.. < ' .i f- j- 
l «Mn  With 4 ( i
Shelv mg < ard Dispay Rati 
Fountain Sign ,V ( lot k VvcnlR 
Step Ladders. Glasses. Ihspr 
Supplies I t .  Watches .V Ban 
Gift Items i . " i « J
Supplies Shampoo*. lilt Hairq 
Supplies. Lireeting L ards. Seho 
Decorations. Patent Medicines.) 
Lighters A Sunglasses. L'andv . 
Etc.

FOR INFORMATION!

A.A. COX OR 
O F F IC E  - 817 6S8- J819 
H O M E  • 817 656-3234

GEF

p lB A C K -T O
FOR l  NEED

W*«E.O
Pocir,

J

8»«
-  w  *'I am*

CONST

SHEET PROTECTORS
J
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Candy .

jid Mi s Carles Valdez San 
> engagement and approaching 

pghte' Fima to Arnaldo Noyola.
Valentin Noyola, San Benito 

1 Texas Women s University and 
ly and has earned a bachelor of 
Lmentary education Her fiance 

■arts degree from Pan American 
ster s degree in biology from the 
[ The couple will marry August 9 

lin the morning at St Joseph 
»n Benito

ibl« O vality

Service
Air Condilioniag 

Central Heating
SEE or CA LL

Metal & Plumbing
iPhone 6S8-3342______Knox City, Texas

M RS D A N IE L  A R T H U R  W E S T E R N
the former Pamela Sue Wilcox

Wilcox-Western  
Vows Exchanged

Pamrla Sue Wilcox became 
the bride of Daniel Arthur 
Western Thursday evening, 
July 31. at the Heights Pres­
byterian Church m Albuquer­
que. New Mexico. The Rev. 
Larry Moss read the double 
ring ceremony.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mrc M a i Sklower and H I 
Wilcox, both of Albuquerque. 
New Mexico.

Attending the bride as 
maid of honor was Miss 
Sandy Guthrie and brides­
maids were Misses Nancy 
Weideman and Kristy Has 
lam.

Harold Gilmore was best 
man and groomsmen were

WALLACE MOORHOUSE INSURANCE
INSURANCE-REAR FSTAIT APPRAISALS

•Vo ur Protection our Profeteion’*
_______P O Drawer q Munday. Texas ~hJ7|

YOU DON’ T TAKE
Knox County News

; i \ \

Y D O N 'C H A ?
CAN T READ
DON'T LIKE I I U  M AILM AN  
NOT ENOUGH NEWS ABOUT IO ( A l  CROOKS 
DON’T KNOW HOW TO S I BSt RIBK 

—  I SW IP I M> NEIGHBORS

But shucks if none of these answers pertain lo YOU and
l«u just haven't taken lime lo subscribe, why don'cha do il , 
llou * 1

Krlurn This Slip To

Knox County News
P O Box 7

KNOX CITY. TEXAS nan
A' HI S i l l
*PI K TO I t

1 >tau«

1,0 F IR  Y EAR W ITH IN  so M i l l s  OF K SOY I  ITY 

110 I m inding MB| M l  >1 AR I I  SI W I I I  Rl IN I I  \  \S 

f *  *  Ft N V I \K  1.1 I III SI M l

Pre-Nuptial Parties 
Fete Miss Tankersley

Tom Wilcox, brother of the 
bride, and Mark Martinez.

Ushers were Clay Bower 
and Jerrv Smyrl, brothers in 
law of the bridegroom

Marian Bower, niece of ihe 
bridegroom, was flower girl 
and Christopher Smyrl. ne 
phew of the bridegroom, was 
ring bearer.

Immediately following the 
ceremony a reception was 
held in the garden al the 
home of Mr and Mrs Max 
Sklower

Miss Nancy Sklower regts 
lered guests and Miss Erin 
McNew served the three 
tiered wedding cake. Misses 
Laurie Kaiser and Diane 
Leigh served punch and cof­
fee

After a honeymoon trip to 
Mexico, the couple will be at 
home in Albuquerque

Mrs Western is employed 
as secretary by the Disabled 
American Veterans ofTtce and 
Western is employed as a 
bookkeeper b Swift and Com- 
pany.

The bride ia the grand­
daughter of M r and Mrs 
Jess Dcnnington of O ’Brien 
and Mrs Nellie Wilcox of 
Knox City.

Doris Howell 
Returns From 
Mexico Trip

Doris Howell, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Taylor, 
has recently returned from a 
Mexico Eield Course sponsor­
ed by Texas Tech University 
in Lubbock where she is a 
junior, majoring in social 
welfare and minonng in Span 
ish.

Ihe S6 Tech students were 
accompanied by two tea. hers. 
Roberto Bravo and Lorum 
Stratton who taughi both 
graduate and undergraduate 
courses. Classes were con­
ducted every day and the 
vtudents received six hours' 
credit.

The group mel in Laredo 
for the annual trip and look a 
bus to San Luis Potosi where 
they lived with pre selected 
Mexican families Doris re­
ported that most of their 
experiences were very enjoy­
able with only a few rxcep 
tions.

Her studies included gram­
mar as well as history and 
culture

The trip included a week's 
stay in Guadalajara and Mrs 
ico City where they rnpived 
sightseeing Doris remarked 
ihal the cathedral in Mexico 
City was one of ihe most 
healthful that she had ever 
seen. The group enjoyed the 
bull fights, hors - races, and a 
family reunion at some of the 
M cik an families with whom 
they were staying

Also on their agenda was a 
one day excursion to Guana­
juato. San Miguel dr Allrndr, 
and Delores Hidalgo

Miss Gayle Tankersley, 
bride-elect of Terry Hamilton, 
was honored with a bridal 
shower Saturday in the home 
of Mrs. E. Hob Smith. Calling 
hour was from 3:30 lo 4:30 in 
the afternoon

Mrs. Paul Clayton greeted 
guests and presented them lo 
the honorcc, her mother, 
Mr Samuel Tankersley; the 
prospective bridegroom's 
mother, Mrs. L V Hamilton 
of Gorec; and the honorre's 
grandmothers. Mrs M.S. 
Low rev and Mrs. J .W Tank­
ersley

Presiding at the guest hook 
was Miss Becky Hawkins,
sisier of the bridegroom

Misses Debbie Reese. De 
Lacy Bateman. Sheryll Guinn, 
and Laura Lynn served finger 
sandwiches, cheese rolls, 
cookies, nuts, and punch from 
a table covered with a white 
cloth Appointments of crystal 
and sliver were used and the 
lahle was centered with an 
eprrgne filled with blue and 
white daisies, the bnde- 
elrcl’s chosen colors

Hostesses were Mmes. 
Tom Brooke Hudson, Boh 
Harrison, Bill Baker, Jeff 
Graham. Herbert Brllinghau- 
sen. Jimmy Lynn. Charles 
Reese. Billy Gene Johnston, 
W J. Roddy. Bill Holcomb, 
tommy Kent. Mary Stone, 
Hob Smith. Paul Clayton, and 
Miss Anne Underwood

HAMBURGER SUPPER
Mr and Mrs Melvin low 

rev and Jan hosted a hambur­
ger supper for their niece and 
her fiancee at their home 
Friday evening 
Guests for the supper were 
the honorees. Mr and Mrs 
Samuel Tankersley. parents

of the bride-elect. Mr and 
Mrs L.V Hamilton and El­
don of Gorec. parents and 
brother of the bridegroom 
elect, his sister, Miss Becky 
Hawkins of Dallas, the cou 
pie's grandparents. M i and 
Mrs Eldon MiSwain of Goree 
and Mrs. M S Lowrey. Mr. 
and Mrs Dan Wad/eck of 
Rochester. Larry Wadzeck of 
Lubbock. M r and Mrs Joe 
Clonlt. Diane and Mark, and 
M r and Mrs Charles Reed. 
Mel and Kevin

KITCHEN SHOWER 
A kitchen shower Thursday 

in the home of Mrs Patricia 
Deering honored Miss lank 
erslcy Mrs. Deertng and 
Shervll Guinn were hostesses 
for the occasion

Refreshments of cookies 
and punch were served guests 
from a table centered with a 
blue and orchid arrangement 

Those attending were the 
honoree. Jane Arledgc. Ttmi- 
lu Graham. Sarah McCau 
ghev. Marcella Durham, Patti 
Lain. Sandy Stubbs. Sheila 
Cobb Jan Lowrey, Debbie 
Reese and ihe hostesses

Weldon P .arr 
Receives Diploma

Weldon Pharr, son of Mr 
and Mrs Ed Pharr of Knot 
City recently completed re­
quirements al Thomas Jeffer­
son High School in San Anto- 
nk> and received his high 
school diploma

Pharr plans lo attend col 
lege this fall

He is the grandson of Mrs 
Opal Hulchinson, also of 
Knox City

, 1975 KNOX COUNTY

l icense Needed 

For Child Core
According to Section 8 (al, 

Article WSc. Vernon v Texas 
Statutes persons must have a 
license lo care for children in 
iheir homes This license it 
issued through The State 
Department of Public Welfare 
and is free of charge

Requirements for a license 
arc summarized as tollowt:
I . Visit from a licensing 

representative.
2 Fire and Health Depart 

ment inspections 
3. A fenced yard 
4 Adequate indoor and out 

door play space 
5. Hot. nutritious lunches 
6 Health card for the day care 

mother.
7. A bed for each child to nap 

on (couches or cots may be 
used)

8 Immunization card on each 
child
All visits from licensing 

representatives are free as 
well as all fire and health 
inspections.

This law protects the child 
trom inadequate care, insures 
nutritious food and personal 
attention The day care moth 
er will receive help at any 
time it is needed from the 
Slate Department of Publk 
Welfare She will have better

NEWS PAGE FIVE
opportunity to receive new 
ideas on foods, play ideas, 
and furthering her knowledge 
of child care.

Anyone now caring for
children or interested in car­
ing tor children, please con­
tact Cathi Weisensee. State
Department of Public W el­
fare. Courthouse. Vernon. 
Texas 76384 (8I7 SS2-6238), 
tor further information on day 
care licensing

IN T R IM M IE R  HOME
Visiting Mrs Bertha Trun­

in ier last week were Mr and 
Mrs Leon M arlin, Deanna. 
Derral. and Danny, Miss 
Martha Blair. M r and Mrs. 
Boh Campbell and grand 
baby. A D (Juallt. and Mrs 
Audir Hill of Eon Worth, 
Mrs Thelma Jones. Mrs 
Joleta Owens and Charlotte, 
and Mrs Billie Patterson all 
ol Dallas. M r. and Mrs Paul 
Russell and Victor Davenport 
of Rochester. Mr Murlene 
Johnston of Henrietta, the 
Chock Reeves. Ruth Dozier 
and Ida Dean Johnston.

IN COLORADO
Mr and Mrs Buster Low- 

rev and Jan returned home 
last week from Colorado 
where they vacationed and 
visited KC residents, Mr and 
Mrs Charlie Clarke and Mrs 
Lorre Clarke who are spend­
ing part of the summer at 
their home near Creedr

Dance to the Music off
The Country Kings

Edward. Mich, Jim, and Glen

Saturday, August 9 
9:30 to 1:30
RHINELAND GYM

A R U G G E D  B O O T  
FOR R U G G E D  C O U N T R Y

Rad W ing 
Cures

ofck x k

Boots Our 
Specialty

Knox C ity

RED WING

BSB-1&7 7

Do V o «
R eliab ility  In Y 
W hy S ettle  to r  U u t?

Where Your Savings Interest Is 

Compounded Daily-Paid Quarter ly

To  B etter Serve You

• 3 8 , 0 0 0 , 0 0 0

Plus in Assets

PASSIh * >K
»0 UAY NOTICE iMHimi 
CERTIFICATE MINIMI M
12 Mo CERTIFICATE 
11 inmi w  MINIMI M
*> Mci CERTIFICATE 
$l .inmi mi Minimum
t» Mo CERTIFICATE 
II IMMi ini MINIMI M
72 Mo INVESTMENT 
CERTIFICATE

5.25%
5.75%
6.50%
6.75%
7.50%
7.75%

5.39%
5.92%
6.72%
6.98%
7.79%
8.06%

I I  inmi ee M IN IM I M DEPOSIT kutomaUrallv 
Krnewahie ( umjxtunded Daily and Paid
CJuartrrly

\  substantial Interest penalty is required for 
early withdrawal

I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I

RETIRED
CUSTOMERS

■ 
i  
i  
i  
i  
i

H A V E  |R E T IR E D  C U S TO M E R S  CAN
| Sot i \i SC M I ( i n  I ill ( K s  SI N l DIRECT | 
I  l 11|< DEPOSII IN \ SAVINGS kCCOI M  | 
I  WHERE IT CAN EARN INTEREST l NTH. | 
I  NEEDED CONTACT ONE o f  Ol K OFFK I 
J TO LEARN MORI VROlTTHIS NEW WAY TO I 
I  SAVE MONEY •

l _________i

INDIVIDUAL 
RETIREMENT 
ACCOUNTS

IN D IV ID U A L  R E T IR E M E N T  A C C O U N T S
I  \i NOW \\ MLABUB FOR YOl PO 91 l ■ 
I  ASIDE l »* TO t lJ P .W  INCOME PER A I \K|
■  TAX DEFERRED IN YOUR S A V IN G S !
■ vet O l  N T  W H E R E  IT  W IL L  E A R N  IN T E R E S T  |
!  UNTIL W IT H D R A W N  F O R  K K T IK K M I NT L X ) |  
J  I I  M i l l  A N D  M A K E  Y O L K  R E T IR E M E N T !  
|  E A S IE R  TO  L IV E  W IT H  I

la ... . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  J

FIRST FEDERAL S A V IN G S  A N D  
LO AN A SSO C IA TIO N
Horn* Office i Branch Office
122 W. McHarg ay Avanut D
P .O . Bos S I I P . O . B o x  444
Mam ford, Texa* 7VSSJ Haskell, Texas 7«*SJ 1 

Phone 864 - ) I T9

I >t vision Office :
Ouanah Federal Saving*
ami Loan
i l  I South M iin  St. 

C«i«n->h, Texas 7'VS2 J t S ' '
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FOREMOST

ALL PURPOSE

b a n q u e t

cherry

D l l  M ONTEDEL M ONTE
SLICES

WHITE SWAN 
CANE

SWANS DOWN

YEl lOW-WHITE

I G A L. p l a s t i c  j u gPARKAY

Laundry 
Soil and Stain 

Remover

THOMPSON
SEEDLESS

GRAPES
RUSSET

POTATOES

CUT GREEN



Stereo Albums Available At
rHE ART STALL -  BOB’S SUPER SAVE -  KNOX COUNTY NEWS

in Knox City and
FRAZIER’S APPLIANCES IN HASKELL 

CALDWELL STUDIOS. 1214 AVE. Q. LUBBOCK

lew Shipment Eight-track Tapes Available At
THE ART STALL AND KNOX COUNTY NEWS

in Knox City

A LB U M S  O n TAPES

piu* 25 tax

M ay be ordered Irom  
Th» K n o i County Now*

P 0  Bo* 7
K no* C ity. T o ia *  79529

(odd 50 tor postage and handing)

Cleaners
I lo ra n a  Bradford Knox City

Happenings
: b r o t h i

and family. Mr and M r*. 
Eddie Bryant. Jennifer and 
J.D. of Levelland 

M r*. L A. Covey and Trudy 
were in Midland la»t Friday 
finding an apartment for Tru­
dy when *he enroll* in M id ­
land College September I. 

lite Oail Kowa' of Lubbock 
visited with her parent*. Mr. 
and M r* Ivan Rowan. Wayne 
and Keith during the week 
end.

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and M r*. Buater Hodge* dur­
ing the weekend were Mr 
and M r*. Gary Morri* and 
Jan of Birmingham. Alaba 
ma, M r, and Mr*. Jerry 
Hodge* and family of Jean, 
Tcre*a llodgc* of Abilene and 
Rhonda. Cindy and Jeffery 
Hodge* of Odessa.

M r*. O.S. Johnston return 
ed from California last week 
where she had visied a few 
days with her son. Mickey, 
who had surger* Mickey 
lives not too far from San 
Diego.

Mr and M r* Rob Johnston 
visited in Grapevine with 
their daughter and husband, 
Mr and M r* Bobby Fail Iasi 
week.

M r. and M r* Bobby Bro­
thers and Robert of Rhone 
came by Saturday to pick up 
Ruby Lee Brother* for a trip 
toTuluro»a, New Mexico for a 
visit with M r*. Olga Teague 
and family. Bobby and family 

in
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ihop Wil l  Close 
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st ll through I6
i are asked to pick up their 
I Saturday noon, August 9.

Baker Speaks WalSWOrthS 

At Junction Meet Hold Reunion

FOARl) Mustang Produc 
er* of Dallas, staked a 5.700 
fool wildcat well five mile* 
south of Crowell. The G. 
McCoy No 1 i* on IbO acre*. 
468 feet from east line and
I .  978 feet from south line.
J . M Seaton Survey.

s“l>i W R Baker was in
Junction Friday afternoon to 
•itrnd a meeting regarding 
tne representation of rural 
*i hools and rural ad valorem 
property taspayers in future 
session* of the Tesas legisla­
ture.

Stale Rep. Jim Nugent of 
Kerrville, speaking to more 
than 85 school superinten­
dents, school board members, 
ind tai assessor-collectors at 
ihe meeting in the Tesas Tech 
University Center in Junction 
hsd harsh words to say about 
Ihe new school bill.

Following on the heels of 
the criticism, Nugent propos­
ed that "some reasonable 
framework of lasing" must be 
achieved to arrive at a fair 
lasing method.

Mr. Baker, long active in 
school finance studies, spoke 
to the group and invited his 
listeners to join a proposed 
property owners' association.

Purpose of the organiza­
tion. he said, will be to 
provide a communication link 
hetwren Austin and school
districts.

From the audience the 
question was asked on the 
impact of the new school bill 
on major urban areas such as 
Dallas. San Antonio. Hous- 
lon, and Nugent shot back the 
reply, " It  was well written for 
their benefit!"

The Walsworth family re­
union was held Saturday and 
Sunday. Auguit 2 and 3 al 
Lake Stamford.

Those attending included 
Jim. Tina. Wendy and Jamie 
Johnston. Lubbock; Kenneth 
and Sammie Roberts. Randy, 
Rodney and Sherry Bum*. 
Plamvtew; Donnie, Marilyn. 
Lance. Kendt and Kari John* 
ton, Lubbock; Audie and Sam 
Johnston. O'Brien; Jim, Lin­
da, Cari and Chaae Hall. 
Memphis; Lynn Wilkinson. 
Olton; Mas. Pat and Marcte 
LaDuke. Fort Worth; Mary 
Nell Hall. Petersburg. Judy 
Rrdtgner, Olton, Patti Wilkin 
son. Olton, Roy and Juantce 
La Duke and boys. Olton; 
Mildred »nd Mouse La Duke. 
Olton M r. and Mrs Roas 
Walsworth. O'Brien; Ruby 
Walsworth. Spur; Bobbie 
Lindsey. Abilene, Jerry, La 
Rue and Robin Riggs. J.C. 
and Debbie Rigg*. China 
Springs. Betty. Patty and 
Terry Waller and Laura 
Bloodworth. Burkburnett. Av­
is and Dick Johnston. Burk 
burnett; Jean and Babe Ban 
ner. Littleffield; Rose Marie. 
Kenneth. Karen and Shirley 
Johnston. Wichita Falls. 
Butch Banner. Albany; Judy. 
Dale, and Billie Ann Sanders. 
Amarillo; and Willie Mae and 
Berlie Banner. O'Brien.

Sunday were a very spinted 
day for Si. Paul. Sunday 
School had a good attend­
ance. Supt. in charge. The 
lesson were resources for 
Christians growth found Phi- 
lipptans 4:4-9 Coloastans 3:1- 
3, 12-17. And were taught by 
Lee Crother* and review by 
the pastor.

For morning service the 
pastor preach a beautiful 
sermon from Matthew 26 26 
27. The sermon were When I 
ter the blood, I will pass over.

In the afternoon. Mrs Do­
rothy Aletander sponsor a 
program. The two time seeker 
Singers of Abilene were the 
honor guest and sponsor the 
Singing

The Sunday school will 
sponsor the Soul Seekers and 
the Gift of God Singers of 
Lubbock Sunday Aug 10 at 3 
p m. Everyone ta invited to 
tome and hear the gospel sin 
songs

Mrs. FI nor* Mallard and 
Mrs. Ima Jean Stssion of 
Albuquerque New M rtico  is

Colorado and New Mexico 
while Kubv Lee visit* with the 
Teagues.

Mr. and Mrs. Ranzy Her­
ring and Mr and Mrs. J.O. 
Brothers attended the Merle 
Haggard show in Abilene last 
week. (The only thing is that 
Merle did not show up. so we 
listened to Tony Douglas and 
the Shrimpers, which I enjoy­
ed more than I would have 
Merle.)

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry John­
ston and family returned from 
Dallas last weekend where 
Jerry had been attending 
school for a week

Mr. and Mrs Ed Whlteley 
visited in Brady during the 
weekend with friends and 
relatives.

Couples Tournament 
To Be August 16-17

The Kno* City Country 
Club Couples Tournament 
has been scheduled for Satur­
day and Sunday. August 16 
and 17.

A nominal fee will be 
charged each team and the 
tourney will be played on 
point system. Trophies and 
merchandise will be given for 
prizes.

Play will be at convenient 
times Saturday with a shot­
gun start on Sunday, a 
spokesman said.

Anyone wishing to enter 
may do so by contacting Faye 
Graham at 817-858-JI27 or 
Imma Jeanne Alexander at 
658 3625.
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spending a week or so with 
their mother Mrs Annie Mac 
Moss and is enjoying vixiling 
Iheir uncle and families Also 
is having fun picking peas (or 
Mama. Earnest Flandrr and 
wife Sharton and baby were 
here Monday to visit Mrs 
Moss and others

Roosevelt Five and family 
of Wichita Falls visit his 
father and family Sunday.

Mrs Willie Brantley is m 
Abilene to lake her grand­
daughter home After they 
spent the summer here with 
her.
SERVICES OF THE  
C H l'R C H  OF GOD 
IN CHRIST

We were blessed in the 
revival held here Iasi week 
Evangelist D R Williams 
conducted the revival.

On Monday night the me* 
sage was from St John I I  28 
“ God is Calling You"

Tue*. night "Count Down 
to the Final Hour", II Timo 
thy 3:1.3.

He also preached from Acts 
I On Thurs. night a pan of 
the members attended service 
at Love Sanctuarv Church in 
Wichita Falls FJ»* t and Mrs 
l .R  (nddingv were celebral 
mg their 2»th Anniversarv at 
that church. Supt Bennett 
preached that night.

Purity Class was held last 
week Sunshine Band. Sun 
dav School and Sundav Morn 
tng service were also held 

The YPWW Joint Meeting 
was held al Ihe Soulhside 
Church in Abilene Sunday 
evening.

Missionary Ward taught 
from Luke 8 43, 4t> "Lord 
Work it O ut", and Minister 
Session preached from Si 
John 9. " I  Don I Need No 
Doctor For the Prescription 
Has Alreadv Been Filled" 

Mtssionarv Ward is con 
ducting a revival this week in 
Rule
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IN OREGON
Mrs. Lois Bruton and son 

Randy of Olney boarded a 
plane in Dallas Monday after 
noon en route to Portland. 
Oregon, where her sister. 
Mrs Ruth Pridgen, and sons 
Stan. Kevin and Kelly, of 
Parkdale. Oregon, will meet 
them They will also visit with 
other relatives in Portland 

Mrv Bruton and Mrs Pnd 
gen are daughters of the A P. 
Denton*

KING Taubert. Steed. 
Gunn A Medders of Wichita 
Falls will drill No 26 A Y S B 
Burnell Estate in the Anne 
Tandy Field 14 note* south­
east of Guthrie in King Coun-
«y-

Dnllsite for the planned 
5.600-foot venture is 2.000 
feet from the northwest and 
2.025 feet from the southwest 
lines of Section I . Block X* 
K M Thompson Survey 

A proposed J.200-foot ven 
lure was staked 20 miles 
southeast of Gulhne in the 
Croton (Tannehill) Field It is 
Sauder, Strange and WEC'O 
I Wuhita Falls No 14 N 

Alexander Trust Estate 
Drtllstte is 750 feet from the 

south and 2.050 feet from the 
west lines of Section 69 Block 
F. HATC Survey 

Nordan Oil A Gas Corp. No 
2 Alexander Trust Estate, 
2.651 feel from the south and 
871 fret from the west lines of 
Section 52. Block F HATC 
Survey, A 1093. wildcat 15 
miles southeast of Guthrie, 
total depth 3,103 feet 

Taubert. Steed. Gunn A 
Medders of Wichita Falls No 
2J A Y SB  Burnette Estate 
was completed in the Anne 
Tandv (5.400 Strawn) Field 

Location is 17 miles south 
east of Guthrie in Section I I .  
Block 1. K M  Thomson Sur 
vey.

Daily pumping potential 
was 200 barrels of 36 gravity 
oil from perforations al 5.408 
18 feet. Total depth ia 5,540 
feet

nf:\vs pack  sev en
FROM HOUSTON

M r and Mrs Wyman l id  
well and daughters. Tammy, 
le rn . and Tract of Houston 
are spending this week visit 
mg her parents. M r and Mrs 

Curtis Coates. They spent 
Monday in Lubbock where 
Tammy looked over the Tech 
campus and then visited Wy 
man's relatives in Levelland 

The Tidwells are also 
spending some time in Mun 
day with his parents. Mr and 
Mrs Jack Tidwell.

EVERYTHING AUTOMOTIVE
Galas Fan Balls. Hoss. Puilays. and 
Light Duly Balls lor A ir Condltlonars

F ram and Hastings O il F illa ra .
A ir Bath F iltars

PIST ON R ING S. G A S K E T S , and  
IN S E R TS  FOR ALL M O TO R S  

M onroa Shock Abaorbars and 
Load Lavalars.

W e also carry a com plete line of TR A C TO R  
PAR TS such as Pistons. Rings. Inaarts, 

Bearings and Gaskats

OWENS AUTO SUPPLY
315 Central Ase. 658 3323

NOTICE
Effect ive Immedia te ly

The Dairy Mart

Thursday

HASKELL Bndwell Oil 
Co. of Wichita Falls and 
Abilene will re-enter and 
deepen to 6,000 feet an 
abandoned wildcat 1 VS miles 
north of Rochester in Haskell 
County

It is No I Iro n  Burson 
located on a IbO acre lease 
Site is 330 leet from the north 
and east lines of Section 228. 
Block 45. HATC Survev

The project was plugged in 
1957 at 5.115 feel as Lone Star 
Producing Co. No I Leon 
Burson

First gas well has been 
completed in the Jud. West 
iBend Conglomerate) F'leld 
seven miles west of R<» he* 
ter.

H is Alvin C. Hope of San 
Antomo No 3 Ira Short, 
located in A. Slavdon Survev 
57.

Absolute, open flow was 
5,000.000 cubic feel of drv gas 
daily h bad a gas liquid, 
hvdrocarbon ratio of 204.444 
I of 63 gravity

Production ia from perfora 
'ions at 5.794 to 5.8000 feet 
with the 4V|.inch casing set at 
5,893 feet, The hole was 
drilled to a total depth of 
5,843 feet and plugged hack 
to 5.8.39 feet
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QUALITY
VARIETY
SERVICE HEIM f c l H

DOUBLE
S & H GRFEN STAMPS

WEDNES DAYS
With Hit Puuhm
01 SZ SO 0i Moit

SPECIALS GOOD 
THOR.,FRI.,SAT.,

AUG. 7-8 9

/

^  BAN Q U ET FROZEN

CREAM PIES
i

»r:

ASSORTED FLAVO R S

EACH

GIANT

BOX

* 1 . 0 9

^ ■ (1 *
'  ^ l l  v l

'CoU
\ MEDAL

ENRJCHtDflO*

G OLD MEDAll

F L O U

w r a p
. > r /

HOLD KOUNTRY

WHIP
TOPPING

>•" t

CTN .

lbs.
_  3

^  A  P o t a t o e s

Satad I omatoes---------"  *. _39c
B a r t l e t t  3 - ' 5 ‘ S V O O

FOLGIRS INST

COFFEE*!
I .10 oz. $  

JA R

peon

A\mmM))11)1)1)lffl

NEW/
OUT POWERS THE POWDERS

Va cup cleans the wash 
beautHully. . .  and gets out 

most greasy, oily dirts.

* 2 . 1 9

2
JU

rturn

KOUNTRY FRESH l l

M  F t 02

M  FL 02 1 . 1 9
1« FL. 02

REDEEM Y O U R  
“'C O U P O N S  A T  H  SYSTEM

H O M O
MILK

O A l .  PLASTI C JUG

$ 1 3 0
■  No Ret urn  

Rntll.

KOUNTRY FRESH
COTTAGE
CHEESE

16 OZ .  CTN

!l

n

DEL M O N TE CUT

GREEN BEAN | his

303
CANS ♦ 1

JENO'S ASSORTEf

P IZZA

3  8 9

e

I VORY

LIQUID__
MRS . BAIRD'S

COCOANUT TWIST_____ ._G_‘! L 5 9 *
DEL MONTE

SPINACH
PARK AY

MARGARINE___________________  1» 4 9 *
DEL MONTE WHOLE DILL m  ^

PICKLES_______  ______ ‘  ■ 4 9 '

PEG. $1.83 $ 1 . 3 9  

$

K e

1 tenn 
lust I

OSCAR MAYER

SLICED BACOI
klent

12 oz. 
PKG. * 1 . 5 9

L O V I N G  c a r e

HAIR COLOR
BRYLCREEM

ARMOUR’S FRANKS
BEEF CUTLETS

ACCt)
Will

iB O LO G N A  ««U. *


