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The Weather
From records of Fred 

Byerly, Weather Observer.
Wed. 17th 98 72
Thurs. 18th Tr. 96 74
Fri. 19th .92 87 68
Sat. 20th 88 67
Sun. 21st 97 67
Mon. 22nd 95 73
Tues. 23rd 94 72
Total precipitation to date

1967 ..............................  11.01
Total precipitation to date

1968 ..............................  16.72

Fire Damages 
^ew  School Bldg.

Fire of undetermined ori­
gin did considerable damage 
to the new high school audi­
torium late Thursday after­
noon. Workmen had stopped 
work some 2 hours before 
the smoke was discovered. It 
apparently originated in in­
sulation material on the floor. 
No official estimate was 
available at press time, but 
reports give some $15,000 
damage. The Fire Dept, did 
a good job in holding the 
blaze and stood by for sev­
eral hours after extinguished

School officials state that 
the auditorium probably will 
not be ready for use by school 
opening, but this will not de­
lay the opening as classrooms 
suffered no damage.
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Cross Roads 
Revival Opens 
Sunday Morning

Service Held For 
Clyde Green

Funeral services for Clyde 
T. Green, 71, were held at 3 
p.m. Sunday at First Baptist 
Church with Rev. Jackie 
Barnett and Rev. Billy Hud- 
nall officiating. Interment 
was in Belview Cemetery un­
der the direction of Weathers- 
bee Funeral Home.

Mri Green died at 3 p.m. 
Wednesday in Callan Hospital 
where he had been a patient 
for two days.

He was bom in White Rock 
in Hunt County Jan. 17, 1897, 
and was married to the for­
mer Ruby Finch, Nov. 30, 
1918. They came to Fisher 
County in 1924. He was a re­
tired farmer and also had 
worked at Weathersbee Fun­
eral Home, a tractor agency 
and for Fisher County for a 
number of years.

Surviving are the wife; one 
daughter, Mrs. Leon House of 
Hobbs, N. M.; a son. Spec. 5 
Jackie R. Green who is serv­
ing with the Army in Viet­
nam; a granddaughter, Cathy 
Green of Irving; eight sis­
ters and two brothers. He was 
preceded in death by two 
sons.

H. D. HALE

Hospital News

Local patients admitted to 
Callan Hospital from July 17 
through July 23 were Mrs. 
Jim O’Briant, Mrs. W. E. 
Etheredge; Tommy White- 
field, Jr, Mrs. Juan Mijares, 
Clint Overby, Mrs. Annie 
Owen, Mrs. Ira Black, Mr. J. 
O. Cooper, Bud Puryear, Mrs. 
Reggie Stinson, R. H. Clark, 
Mrs. Felix Almanza, Mrs. Jer­
ry Boen, Mrs. Mary Starnes, 
Carmen Quintanilla, Richard 
Garcia and Becky LeBleu. 

Out of town patients:
Mrs. B. F. Campbell, Lub- 

V. J. Sewell, Snyder; Mrs. 
bock; Mrs. W. L. Burk, Roby; 
Lizzie Byrd, Clairmont; R. C. 
Doty, Roby; Mrs. Jimmy 
Huckaby, Big Spring; Mrs. S. 
L. Etheredge, Hermleigh; Mrs. 
Jerry Hale, Midland; Van C. 
Melton, Hamlin; J. E. Patton, 
Aspermont.

Births:
A 9 lb. 4 oz. boy was born 

to Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Hale 
of Midland, at 10:20 a.m. 
July 24.

A 9 lb. 6 oz. girl, Melissa 
was born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Juan Mijares at 8:50 a.m. 
July 20.

A 8 lb. 15 oz. boy, Wes­
ley Reginald, was born to 
Mr. and Mrs. Reggie Stinson 
at 7:30 a.m. July 20.

A 6 lb. 12 oz. boy, Kenny, 
was born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Felix Almanza at 1:30 a.m. 
July 23.

GORDON APPLEBY
C r o s s  Roads Baptist 

Church is announcing Revival 
starting Sunday morning to 
continue thm Aug. 4th.

Morning services will be at 
11 o’clock and evening ser­
vices 8:00 p.m. Prayer ser­
vice at 7:30 each evening.

Bro. Hale is recognized as 
a dynamic preacher and a 
great man of God. He has pas- 
tored for more than 30 years, 
24 of them at Memorial Bap­
tist Church at Pasadena, Tex­
as. He is a very forceable 
preacher and has done much 
work in various church fields.

Gordon Wayne Appleby, 
son of Rev. and Mrs. J. C. 
Appleby, pastor of the 
Cross Roads church, is a jun­
ior at East Texas Baptist Col­
lege and is also a licensed 
Baptist minister. Although 
only 21 years of age, he has 
done vast amount of work 
for the church. He will be in 
charge of music for the Revi­
val, and is doing summer re­
vival work, both singing and 
preaching.

The pastor and congrega­
tion invites the general pub­
lic to attend any and all ser­
vices.

4-H Members 
To State Lab

Fisher County Exension 
Agents Mrs. Alice Ballenger 
and Richard A. Spencer have 
announced the names of the 
six 4-H club members who 
have been chosen to attend 
the State 4-H Club Junior 
Leadership Laboratory at 
Brownwood Juy 29 - August 
3. The Lab is sponsored by 
Pennzoil United,. Inc. in co­
operation with the Texas Co­
operative Extension Service.

The delegates are Jerry 
Mash; Mike Herron; Donald 
Sheffield; Aletha Morgan; 
Peggy Ann Coffman; and 
Gina Eaton. They were among 
the 72 delegates selected from 
each of the 12 Extension Dis­
tricts in the State on the basis 
of past performance in lead­
ership and citizenship in their 
respective counties.

In addition to the delegates 
chosen on a district-wide bas­
is, 6 Junior Leaders are se­
lected from other counties to 
attend the Lab for demonstra­
ting outstanding leadership in 
4-H Club work. These 6 Jun­
ior Leaders will assist the 
Extension Staff in conducting 
and coordinating the week- 
long activity. The theme of 
the Lab this year is Effective 
Communications. Expenses 
provided by Pennzoil United, 
Inc. will amount to more than 
$5,000.00.

The purpose of the Lab is 
to teach the delegates new 
leadership skills and to devel­
op knowledge and attitudes 
which will continue to an un­
derstanding of themselves 
and others in their ccmimuni- 
ties.

The Lab, part of a broad 
4-H Junior Leadership Pro­
gram, has been sponsored by 
Pennzoil United, Inc. in co­
operation with the Extension 
Service for 19 consecutive 
years. The Company, in ad­
dition to sponsoring the all­
expense paid trip, will pre­
sent the delegates with fram­
ed certificates in recognition 
of the outstanding achieve­
ments in 4-H Club work.

Posse and Jrs. 
2nd at Snyder

Fisher County Sheriff Posse 
placed second in Parade for 
Snyder Rodeo July 17th. The 
Junior group also took a sec­
ond.

Their Play Nite has been 
changed to Friday nights for 
remainder of summer. This 
starts at 7:30 p.m. in the local 
arena.

Mother of E. 
Gladson Dies

Mrs. Nola Gladson, 77, died 
at 10:30 am. Saturday at Sny­
der Hospital after a six- 
months illness. She was 
mother of Eugene Gladson of 
Rotan.

Funeral was held at 3 p.m. 
Sunday in the East Side 
Church of Christ, with the 
minister. Bill Minnick, o 
fi'ciating. Burial was in Sny­
der Cemetery.

Nephews were pallbearers.
Bom Aug. 9, 1890, in

Comanche County, she mar­
ried E. W. Gladson Oct. 18, 
1935, in Snyder. She was a 
member of the Church of 
Christ.

Survivors include her hus­
band; one son, Eugene Glad­
son of Rotan; four sisters, 
Mrs. Albert Martin, Mrs. R. 
D. Payne, Mrs. Will Taylor 
and Mrs. R. W. Boyd, all of 
Snyder; three grandchildren 
and two great-'grandohildren.

One son, Rex, preceded her 
in death in 1960.

MEXICAN SUPPER 
ST. JOSEPH’S CHURCH

St. Joseph’s Catholic 
Church announces a Mexi­
can Supper for Saturday night 
from 6 to 9 p.m. The supper 
will be in Parish Hall.

Adult plate will be $1 and 
Child’s 50c.

Everyone is invited to at­
tend.

CALENDAR CLUB PLANS 
FAMILY PICNIC

The Calendar Club annual 
family picnic will be held in 
Towle Memorial Park, Sny­
der, Saturday, July 27 at 
7:00 p.m. All members and 
their families are invited to 
attend. Each member is to 
bring chicken and dishes for 
her family. Please contact 
social committee if unable 
to attend.

Local Youth Is 
Hero in Recent 
Lake Tragedy

We read of the tragic 
drowning of L. D. Rush of 
Hobbs, N.M. in Lake Sweet­
water, July 4th, and the res­
cue of Mrs. Rush when their 
boat swamped, but the hero 
of the tragedy was not im­
mediately named.

This week in a letter to 
Editor of Sweetwater Report­
er, Mrs. Rush had found, sev­
eral days after the rescue that 
a Rotan youth, Ronnie Kin­
caid had saved her life in 
swimming to her, and to safe­
ty. He iis son of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. W. Kincaid of Rotan. Mrs. 
Rush in her letter below 
states that she would like to 
help with a scholarship for 
Ronnie in appreciation.

Since Ronnie is a 17-year 
old Senior in the 1968-69 Ro­
tan Senior Class we feel that 
some of our civic organiza­
tions would take the pro­
ject of completing the schol­
arship Mrs. Rush has started. 
We also feel sure the Hobbs 
community, where Ronnie 
was born and attended school 
until recently, would like to 
have a part on such move.
■ Ronnie and his family are 
veiy modest, and his heroism 
probably would have never 
been made public, but for 
Mrs. Rush showing her appre­
ciation. She had difficulty in 
finding who had rescued her. 
Ronnie just thought he was 
doing what he should, regard­
less of endai^gering his own 
life— he was'beared in such 
atmosphere. This act should 
give us renewed faith in our 
youth — not judging all by 
a very small minority of off­
beats.

Its the American way of 
life to show appreciation 
when someone endangers his 
own life to save a fellowman, 
and since we now have it at 
home, we’ll be happy to help 
any organization on a move.

Mrs. Rush’s letter:
Editor,

July 4th of this year, my 
husband drowned in Lake 
Sweetwater. Throughout all 
the tragic hours during and 
following the accident, many 
kind people in Sweetwater 
did all possible to help his 
family.

We particularly are grate­
ful to excellent officials, Mr. 
Patterson of the funeral home 
personnel at Simmons Me­
morial Hospital and the 
James Rycroft family. Just 
how to convey this gratitude, 
we do not know.

If you can, I need your as­
sistance in some small form 
of recognition to Ronnie Kin­
caid of Rotan, Texas, the 17- 
year old boy who pulled me 
from the water. There is no 
truly effective way I can 
thank him for saving my life 
— as a small token, I should 
like to start, if the conditions 
warrant, or add to his schol­
arship fund or plans for col­
lege. Since we are not weal­
thy I was thinking in terms 
of $250. This is a pittance, I 
realize, but I have known 
young men who had scholar­
ships of such an amount to 
complete their educations 
based on this as a start.

Since we live in Hobbs and 
I work, I should appreciate 
your help in the initial de­
velopment of recognizing 
Ronnie, as well as some note 
of appreciation to the fine 
people of Sweetwater for 
their help in a truly distress­
ing time.

Sincerely,
Mrs. Louie D. Rush
1817 Penasco
Hobbs, N.M.

Roby Service For 
Mrs. W. L. Burk

Mrs. W. L. Burk, 82, of 
Roby died at 11:30 a.m,. Sun­
day in Callan Hospital. She 
suffered â  stroke in her home 
Thursday and had been hos­
pitalized since then.

Services were at 10 a.m, 
Monday in the First Baptist 
Church of Roby with Rev. 
Orvel Brantley,  ̂pastor, of­
ficiating, assisted by Rev. C. 
A. Sanders, pastor of West 
Side Baptist Church in Roby.

Burial was in the Roby 
Cemetery under direction of 
Weathersbee Funeral Home.

Pallbearers were Ben Har­
ris, Melvin Burk, Milton 
Burk and Buddy Murff.

Born Ida Lee Mooney at 
Rockwell, Oct. 18, 1885, she 
married Perry N. Stewart in 
Lee County in 1903. He died 
in 1951. She married W. L. 
Burk in 1954.

She was a member of the 
First Baptist Church.

Survivors include her hus­
band of Roby; two sons, Paul 
O. Stewart of San Antonio 
and Perry A. Stewart of Aus­
tin; two stepsons, J. D. Burk 
of Rotan and Harvey Burk 
of Long Beach, Calif.; two 
stepdaughters, Mrs. Marie 
Thomas of Lubbock and Mrs, 
Charles Atwell of Rotan; 
eight grandchildren and 18 
greatgrandchildren.

Tuesday Service 
For Sam Wiley

Sam Wiley, 83, retired Ro  ̂
tan farmer, died at his home 
early Sunday morning follow­
ing an apparent heart attack. 
He was found by his daugh­
ter, Mrs. Emma Howard, 
who lived with him.

Services were at 4 p.m. 
Tuesday in Weathersbee 
Chapel with Rev. Jackie Bar­
nett, pastor of Calvary Bap­
tist Church, officiating. Buri­
al was in Belview Cemetery.

Born Oct. 29, 1884, at Over- 
ton, he married Pearl Barbee 
Dec 11, 1902. She died sever­
al years ago.

Mr. Wiley came to Rotan 
from Dublin in 1920. He was 
a member of the Baptist 
church at Sardis.

Other survivors include one 
son, Cecil of Odessa; a dau  ̂
ghter-in-law, Mrs. Jewell Wi­
ley of Levelland; seven grand­
children and 14 great grand­
child.

Pioneer Grocer 
Dies Tuesday

Elmer Price, 74, a pioneer 
grocery merchant of Rotan 
died at 6 p.m. Tuesday in 
Callan Flospital. He had been 
in ill health for the past sev­
eral years, following an auto­
mobile accident near Albany. 
He had been in the local hos­
pital and Veterans Hospitals 
in Big Spring and ElPaso 
much of the time.
He had been in the grocery 
business many years and was 
active until the accident.

Funeral service is pending, 
from First Methodist Church 
with Rev. Bob Ford officiat­
ing. Burial will be in Bel­
view cemetery.

Pall bearers will be, Glen 
Holt, Kenneth Kelly, James 
Springer, Dan Park, Judson 
Thompson and Rudy Hamric.

Born July 7, 1894, in Erath 
County, he was the son of 
the late Mr. and Mrs. J. W. 
Price, He came to Rotan 
shortly after the town was 
established.

He was a veteran of World 
War I and was active in vet­
erans affairs church and civic 
matters.

Mr. Price served in France 
during WWI with the 142 In­
fantry, 36th Division, trained 
at Camp Bowie before going 
to France in 1917.

Survivors include his wife, 
of Rotan; one daughter, Mrs. 
Gerald Hendrix of El Paso; 
two granddaughters, Mrs. 
Beth House of Chicago and 
Patricia Hendrix of El Paso; 
three brothers, Ruben of La- 
mesa; Russell of Mountain 
View, Calif., and S. T, of Mo­
desto. Calif. Three sisters, 
Mrs. Dealva Cayce, Dallas; 
Mrs. Lucille Hedgpeth, Lub­
bock and Mrs. Bernice Al­
ford, Los Angeles, Calif.

MISS BAIRD SPENDING 
TIME IN MEXICO

Miss Josie Baird left Satur­
day for Saltillo, Mexico 
where she is enrolled at the 
“ Universidad International” . 
She was accompanied by a 
cousin, Mrs. J. E. Lincoln of 
Lamkin, Texas.

While in Saltillo the ladies 
will enjoy the hospitality of 
a native family, speak the 
Spanish language, and learn 
first-hand of the culture and 
customs of the country.

Following the session at the 
University in Saltillo, they 
plan a leisurely tour of the 
scenic west coast of Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. George Field 
were in Sonora Saturday and 
Sunday to be with Mr. and 
Mrs. Tom Love. He is 93 
years of age and suffered a 
stroke Thursday night at the 
ranch home near Roosevelt.

T. C. Adams Dies 
of Heart Attack

Funeral for Thomas C. Ad­
ams Sr., 74, farmer in Camp 
Springs area, was held at 2 
p.m. Tuesday at the First Bap­
tist Church here with Rev. 
Thurman Upshaw of Pampa 
officiating, assisted by Billy 
Hudnall, pastor of First Bap­
tist Church of Rotan.

Burial was in Belview 
cemetery under direction of 
Weathersbee Funeral Home.

Mr. Adams was dead on ar­
rival at 7:30 p.m. Sunday at 
Cogdell Memorial Hospital in 
Snyder after an apparent 
heart attack at a nei^bor’s 
home.

He has farmed in the Camp 
Springs area 18 years. He 
married Lillie Vallie Adams 
in 1916.

Survivors include his wife; 
five sons, Charles W, and 
Herman R., both of Snyder, 
Thomas C, of Odessa and 
Troy H. and Gerald N., both 
of Kermit; six daughters, Mrs. 
R. E. Johnson of Abilene, 
Mrs. James McAlpine and 
Mrs. Boyce Lay, both of 
Odessa, Mrs. John D. Hopper 
of Brownwood, Mrs. Darwyn 
Metcalf of Tulia and Mrs. Roy 
Nedes of Snyder; one sister, 
Mrs. John Duncan of Hills­
boro; one half brother. Bud 
Snearley of Dumont.

One daughter, Nancy Car- 
roll preceded him in death.

Deborah Smith 
1st Dress Revue

Deborah Sue Smith, 15 year 
old daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
A. A. Smith of McCaulley 
was winner of the Fisher 
County 4-H Dress Revue held 
Thursday in the Community 
Building in Rotan, according 
to Mrs. Alice Ballenger, 
County H. D.. Agent.

Twenty-four 4-H girls who 
had completed garments in 
the recent workshops model­
ed in the Revue.

In the 9-11 year group 
winning blue ribbons were 
Revis Cauble, Ruth Gramet- 
baur, Susan Knox, Arvinella 
Smith and Eugenia Terry. Red 
ribbon winners included Jen­
na McClure, Raymona Mc­
Combs and Judy Wright. 
Winning white ribbons were 
Betty Allen, Kim Boyd, Irma 
Carrillo and Jana Funderburg.

Winner o<f the 12-13 year 
age group was Terry Posey, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ted 
Posey of Roby. Other blue 
ribbon winners in this group 
were Audrey Carey, Annette 
Cleveland, Jennifer Holcomb. 
Red ribbons went to Cindy 
Mash and white to Patricia 
Funderburg, and Becky Shef­
field.

Other blue ribbon winners 
in the Senior division than 
Deborah Sue were Shirley 
Gann, Karla Kreidel, and 
Judy Scherwitz. Red ribbon 
was Linda Morgan.

Both Deborah Sue and Ter­
ry will model in the District 
in  4-H Dress Revue which is 
to be August 2 in Vernon,

Commentator for the Revue 
was Kay Schubert with music 
by Cindy Mash, Eugenia Ter­
ry and Annette Cleveland.

Decorating was a Spanish 
theme by Mrs. Thurman Ter­
ry, Mrs. Don Wright and 
Sandra Herron.

Entry prizes were given by 
Davis Dept. Store, Rotan 
Dept. Store, Dardens Dept. 
Store, and Winns Varety 
Store in Rotan. Also Noles 
Drug, Hayes Grocery, Cash 
Food and Cokers Grocery in 
Roby.

Judges for the event were 
Mrs. Katherine Owen, Kent 
County Home Demonstration 
Agent and Mrs. M. V. Jay, 
Kent County Adult Leader.

The Fisher County Home 
Demonstration Council fur­
nished ribbons for awards 
and served refreshments fol­
lowing the Revue. Women 
serving were Mrs. W. P. Cur­
ry, Mrs. Joe Little, Mrs. W. 
P. Schubert, Mrs. lyie 
Hughes.

Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Burch 
had an unusual experience 
last week while traveling in 
Grayson County. Of course 
they had a “Little Old Lady 
from Rotan” bumper sticker 
on their rear bumper. They 
noticed a pickup following 
close behind for some time, 
finally passing them. The 
driver had hand lettered a 
sheet of paper with ‘Do you 
know Ray Rivers?’ . He held 
this up in his rear window 
and stopped a short distance 
ahead. When they pulled up 
they found him to be son-in- 
law of Mr. Rivers and they 
had an enjoyable visit. He 
was very interested in the 
‘Little Old Lady’ story.

SCOUTS TO HAVE 
COURT OF HONOR

Boy Scouts, Troop 133 of 
Rotan, will have Court of 
Honor Thursday, July 25, 7:30 
p.m. at the Community Cen­
ter. The public is invited. 
Parents please attend.

SINGING AT NURSING 
HOME TONIGHT

The Fisher County Singing 
Group will meet tonight, 7:30 
in Fisher County Nursing 
Home.

If you enjoy good singing 
come and join the group in 
gospel hymns.

Alvin Crow of Euless visit­
ed his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. W. Crow here Sunday and 
Monday.

Mrs. Charles Signor of Lub­
bock and her daughter, Mrs. 
Dtvid Hutson of Dallas visit­
ed Mrs. H. C. Shelton Sun­
day afternoon.

Public Auction at Rotan School Friday, 10 A. M.



LffiBY’S

Thriftway
DOG FOOD C an talo u p e s

Potatoes

Viennia
SAUSAGE

for $ 1

5 Lh. Bag -- Imperial

with purchase of 
2 Lb. Box Shurfine 
T E A - ( 7 5 c )

Honey Boy -- Tall Can

Salmon
6 9 c

Shortening Jewel -  3 lb. can
Limit One
with $5.00 or more purchase 39c

SHURFINE —  303

Pears
HIGH PLAIN —  303 CAN

Beans
SHURFINE CUT

Beans

Welch -  24 Oz.

Grape
Jnice

2 6 9 ^

3 for $1
Tomatoes 5 hr $1

CREAM PIE
Orange Juice

RANCH STYLE

3 h r  49c
4  for $1

Mortons 
(Limit 4)

Shurfine
6 0 z .

BEEF
LIVER
U.S.D.A. GRADED GOOD

ROUND
STEAK
Parkay

Lb.

3 d c u

BEEF
RIBS
OLE-FASmON

BACK
BONE

25c 
3 4 9 '

2 9 c u
A

3 9 c u .

OLEO
c

Lb.

Prices Good Thurs. July 25 to Wed. July 31

SUPER  MKT
FINEST MEAtS IN TOWN

g Len  h o l t - owner & m'anacer^ ^ ^ ^
ROTAN, TEXAS , ^

Prices are Born Here -  Raised Elsewhere



CALVARY BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Phone V/I 2525 
Rev. Jackie Barnett, Pastor 

Comer Grenevieve and 
Stonewall

Sunday School . .  10:00 a.m. 
tioming Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union . .  6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship . 7:00 pm  

Midweek Prayer Service 
Wednesday - 7:30 p.m.

CROSS ROADS 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

C6 Miles SW of Rotan)
Phone WI 7-2097 Rotan

Sunday School . .  10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union . .  6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship . 7:00 p.m. 

Midweek Prayer Service 
Wednesday - 7:30 p.m.

FIPvST
ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

CHURCH
Rev. W. D. Adams, Pastor 

I was not disobedient unto 
the heavenly vision. Acts 
26:19. The vision of God's 
work and the desire to help 
others should always char­
acterize the Christian. 
Sunday School . .  10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship . 7:30 p.m, 

Wednesday Night

FIRST
BAPTIST CHURCH 

201 N. McKinley WI /-3471 
Rev. Billy Hudnall, Pastor 

Sunday School . .  9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union . .  6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday . . . .  7:30 p.m.

Midweek Prayer Service 
A Complete Program, for All 

Fully Air Conditioned 
Nursery Open

FIRST METHODIST 
CHURCH 

209 N. McKinley 
Ph. WI 7-2334 

Robert D. Ford, Pastor 
Parsonage 405 Johnston 

Phone WI 7-2352 
Sunday Sduxd . .  9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:30 a.m,
MYF ..................  6:00 p.m.
Evening Service . 7:00 p.m, 
Monday Circle . .  3:00 p.*m. 
Joy Circle 1st and 3rd

Tuesday . . . .  9:30 a.ni. 
Wed. Prayer Circle 9:30 a.m. 
Choir Practice Wed.

7:30 p.m.
Official Board Meeting 1st 

Wednesday of Moiith

HIGHLAND HOME 
BAPTIST CHURCH

Rev. Lenord Payne, Pastor 
Sunday School . .  10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union . .  7:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship . .  8:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening Prayer 

Service - 8:00 p.m. 
Worship with us and you 

will feel at home - Welcome

LITTLE ZION 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. L. E. Pope, Pastor 
Sunday School . .  9:45 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m.
B.T.U. ..................  5:00 p.m.
Evening Service . .  6:00 p.m. 
Mission Monday . 4:00 p.m.

Wednesday Night 
Prayer Meeting . .  7:00 p.m. 

Thursday
Jr. Mission, 3:30 to 4:30 p.m.

areal 
VACATION

-------

CopyrigM MBS
Keister AdverUshtg Im .
Stratlvrff, Vob

They had waited for this real vacation —  this long trip —  for years. But 
this time it was different, this time he wouldn’t be going back to his job.

At first, retirement seemed frightening, like being shut off from the main­
stream of life. He had seen too many men age beyond their years, after their 
career ended. He had no wish to be on the sidelines. He and his wife could have 
moved to a warmer climate and just have taken it easy. He didn’t want that. 
So, before he left home, he had a long talk with his minister.

He found that there was plenty a man his age could do. Financially se­
cure, he could afford to volunteer for a job. In fact, through the Church there 
was work he could do that would spread to the farthest corners of the world.

Right now, he is enjoying this vacation. He is savoring every moment of 
it. Because, when he gets home, he’s going to lead a full and useful life. And 
that’s the way he wants it.

THE CHURCH FOR ALL . . .
. . .  ALL FOR THE CHURCH
The Church is the greatest factor 

on earth for the building of charac­
ter and good citizenship. It is a 
storehouse of sp iritual values. 
Without a sti'ong Church, neither 
democracy nor civ iliza tion  can 
survivm. There are four sound 
reasons why every person shou’ l  
attend services regularly and sup­
port the Church. They arc: (i)I''cr 
his own sake. (2) For his children’s 
sake. (3) For the sake of his com­
munity and nation. (4) For the 
sake of the Church itself, which 
needs his moral and material sup­
port. Plan to go to church reg­
ularly and read your Bible daily.

S unday
Isa iah

3 2 :9 -2 0

M o n d a y
Luke

1 2 :1 3 -3 1

T u esd ay  W ed n e s d a y  ‘In u rsd c y  
A cts  1 C o rin th ia n s  Colossrans 

1 :6 -1 1  1 2 :1 4 -3 1  1 ;9 -1 4

F rid ay
....1 Thessalontans

1 :1 -8

S a tu rd a y  \  1 i w  
l i  T im o th y  

2 :2 0 -2 6

<XV? f <si2? t  <si2? t  <212? t  Ŝ22? t  <Si2? t  ^Si2? t  ^  t  <si2? t  <522? t  <d2? t  W ?

SAINT JOSEPH’S 
CHURCH

305 E. Lee St. WI 7-3285 
Rev. Hilarin Lai»nski, Pastor 
Masses Sundays —

7:00 - 9:00 ojn. 
Mondays and Saturdays —  

8:30 a.m.
Tuesdays, Wednesdays, and
Thursdays ..........  7:30 p.m.
Confessions: Saturdays —  

7:00 p.m.
Missions: Sacred Heart, 

(near Hamlin)
Mass Fridays___ 6:00 p.m.
Sacred Heart, Aspermont - 
Mass Sundays . .  10:15 a.m.

LATIN AMERICAN 
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Lincoln and Sherman Ave. 
SUNDAY

Bible Classes for all ages 
10 to 11 a.m.

Worship Service, 11 to 12.. 
Worship Service —

11 to 12 a.m.
Evening Service 7:00 to 8:00 
Wednesday: 7:30 to 8:30 p.m. 

Jesse Salazor, Minister

FORESQUARE
CHURCH

Eignth and Greneviene 
B. A. Cheek, Pastor 

Sunday School . .  10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 

Midweek Service 
Wednesday Nite 

Singspiration & Fellowship 
Psalms 122:1: I was glad
when they said unto me. Let 
us go into the house of the 
Lord.

ROTAN CHURCH OF 
CHRIST

Scott Mitchell, Minister 
SUNDAY

Bible Study, 9;45 a.m. and 
6:00 p.m.

Worship, 10:30 a.m. and
7:00 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY 
Bible Study for all age 

7:30 p.m. 
THURSDAY

Worship at Nursing Home 
5:30 p.m.

HOBBS BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Bob Doss, Pastor 
Sunday School . .  10:00 a.nv 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union . .  6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship . 7:00 p.m. 

Midweed Prayer Service 
Wednesday . .  7:00 p.m.

IGLESIA BAUTSTA
1st Mexican Baptist Church 
W. Johnston & N. Garfield 
Rev. W. C. Carrasco, Pastor 
Sunday School . .  10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union . .  7:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship . 7:45 p.m. 

Midwedc Prayer Service 
Wednesday . .  7:30 p.m.

SARDIS BAPTIST 
CHURCH

(9 miles SW of Rotan) 
Rev. Tom Robertson 

Sunday School . . . .  10: a.m. 
Morning Worship . .  11 a.m. 
Training Union . .  6:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship . 7:30 p.m. 

Midweek Prayer Service 
Wednesday, 7:30 p.m.

NAZARENE CHURCH
Lee and McKinley St.
F. P. Bozman. Pastor 

Parsonage-Phone WI 7-3256 
Church Phone - WI 7-3094 

Sunday School . .  9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:40 a.m.
NYPS .................. 6:30 o. m.
Evening ..............  7:00 p.nu

Midwedc Prayer Service 
Wednesday . . . .  7:00 d. m.

Mac* Burger Bar

Rockwell Bro. & Company

J. D. Burk Grocery & Market

Heleman & Neeley Garage

Farm Tractor & Service, Inc

H. L. Davis & Company 

Rotan Insurance Agency

Winn’s Variety Store 

Rotan Cotton Oil Mill 

Weathersbee Funeral Home 

Rotan Gin

Bill Simmons Texaco Station 

Thrift way Super Market 

H. R. Puryear-Contractor 

Rotan Motor Company 

Smiith & Cyphers Gulf Station

First National Bank 

Crest View Lodge
PHONE 735-2234

Fisher County Farm Bureau 

Landes* Furniture 

Home Lumber Co, 

Farmers Gin 

Rotan Department Store 

Rotan Seed Delinting Co., Inc. 

Rotana Restaurant
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WHAT IS CONTOURING?
Contour farming is one of 

the easiest and most widely 
used conservation practices. 
It is the use of plows mov- 
ng across a piece of landL 
When a farmer farms on the 
contour, he ignores the 
straight bounderies and rows, 
and follows curved lines 
whenever necessary to stay 
on the contour.

Contour farming should be 
used in combination with 
crop rotations, grassed water­
ways, fertilizers and return­
ing ô rganic matter to the soil. 
Contouring alone will not 
stop erosion but it reduces it 
nearly 50 per cent on a wide 
range of soil. Steepness of 
slope is important, as well as 
the crop grown and the con­
dition of the soil.

There are other advantages 
of contour farming. In low- 
rainfall areas it helps hold 
and conserve rainfall. Farm­
ers have found that it saves 
power, time, and wear on ma­
chinery.

For further information, 
you may contact the local 
Soil Conservation Service.
—written by Randy Smith in 
meeting requirements for a 
Boy Scout Merit Badge.

CARPET
See us for your Carpet 
Needs. We have Carpets 
in Stock ond other sam­
ples to choose from.
We have professional 
personal to install all our 

carpets with your 
satisfaction guaranteed

Landes Furniture
735-3171 Rotan

INTER9STED IN A WELL 
PAYING CAREER

Come by Charles & Sue’s 
School of Beauty at 2207 Av­
enue S, Snyder and see us 
about your future as a hair­
dresser. We have an easy 
payment plan that will meet 
your individual needs. No 
tuition will be due for 30 
days after enrollment. Don’t 
delay, start today on your fu­
ture as a professional hair­
dresser. 12-4tc

FARMERS UNION 
INSURANCES

*1
FULL COVERAGE

.  HOME • FARM__„,, 
» FAMILY • AUTO • HOSPITAl
• FARM TRUCK • CROP HAIL
•  FIRE • LIFE RETIREMENT

• FARM LIABILITY
• HOMEOWNERS
•  FARMOWNERS

^  COMPlfTf tHSUKMCt NOtfi

^ I
\ ̂  UliVIUMeM

Sm
C D. HERRON 

Agent
Across SL from Bank

Rotan - Ph. 735-333

INTERESTED IN WELL 
PAYING CAREER

Come by Charles & Sue’s 
School of Beauty at 2207 Ave. 
S, Snyder and see us about 
your future as a hairdresser. 
We have an easy payment 
plan that will meet your in­
dividual needs. No tuition 
will be due for 30 days after 
enrollment. Don’t delay, 
start today on your future as 
a professional hairdres­
ser. 12-4tc

SHARP’S PEST 
CONTROL

Home Owned and Oper­
ated — All work guaran., 
teed — Free Check & 
Estimate for All Kinds 

of Insects 
Phone Collect 

GORDON SHARP 
Ph. HI 3-5911 Rt. 1 

Snyder, Texas



Bride-Elect 
Is Honored

Donna Compton, bride-elect 
o f  Eddie Mac Lang was hon­
ored Thursday night with a 
Gift Party at the home of 
Mrs. Wash Rivers. Co-host­
esses with. Mrs. Rivers was 
Mrs. Pete Polk, Mrs. Willie 
Rivers,. Mrs. Lee Martin. Mrs. 
John Leach, Mrs. L. B. Berry, 
Mrs. Lee Decker, Mrs. Don- 
aid Overby, Mrs. Charlie Mes- 
sick, Mrs. Clint Overby and 
Mrs. Steye Kelly.

Receiving guests with the 
honoree was her mother, Mrs. 
Don Compton of Hamlin and 
her fiance’s mother, Mrs. H. 
B. L Lang of Rotan.

A yellow center piece on a 
lace covered table, carried out 
the bride-elect’s color. The 
wedding will be July 28 at 
Ingram, Texas.

HERE FOR FUNERAL 
OF CLYDE GREEN

Among out of town friends 
and relatives attending fun­
eral service for Clyde Green 
were:

Mr. and Mrs. Clarease O’- 
Briant; Mr. and Mrs. Truman 
Upshaw; Mrs. Van Marte; 
Mrs. Mamie Moulton; Mrs. 
Nina Cave; Mrs. Gracie Ed­
wards; Don Pullig; Mrs. W. R. 
Noles; Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Chance; Mrs. Ouida Schleis- 
ing and children; Mr. and 
Mrs. Philip Goodrum; Mrs. S. 
H. Haley; Mr. and Mrs. James 
Cave; Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Sharp; Wesley Hardy; Nona 
Thompson; Mr. and Mrs. J. 
L. McKimmey; Ora Upshaw; 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Upshaw 
and boys; and Herman Up­
shaw of Roby.

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Finch, 
Merkel; Mrs. Margaret Coop­
er, Big Spring; Mrs. J. W. j 
Floyd, Kansas; Mrs. Bert O’- j 
Neal; Mr. and Mrs. S. L. Mor- j 
xis; Mr. and Mrs. Dewayne I 
Lee, Snyder, Mrs. Allen Nel- j 
son, Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. | 
Bradley Brittain, So. Carolina; j 
Mrs. Romie McCullough; | 
Mr. and Mrs. C. C. Cate, 
and Mrs. Freda Randolph, 
Sweetwater; Mrs. E. C. Mc- 
Whirter, Pearland, Tex.; Mr. 
and Mrs, Tipp Green and 
Donna, Wolf City; Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee Everheart; Jim 
Turnbull, San Angelo; Arch 
Turnbull, Jr., White Sands, 
N.M.; Mr. and Mrs. Johnny 
Norwood; Throckmorton; Mr. 
and Mrs. Hershell Hunter; 
Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Shannon, 
and Mr. and Mrs. J, T. Green, 
Garland.

Mrs. Nellie Vanhoozer; 
Mr, and Mrs. Ted Green; 
Mr. Ray Green; Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Trotter; Mr. and Mrs.
B. R. Warren; Mr. and Mrs. 
Luther Robinson; Mr. and 
Mrs. Leon Newman and son; 
Mr, and Mrs. Austin Green; 
and Burl Green, Greenville; 
Mr. and Mrs. Mack Compton, 
Celeste; Mrs. Lula Bickham, 
Dallas; Sam Vanhoozer; Fran- 
cdsi Newton, Midland; Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Whitlock, 
Hobbs. N.M.‘ Mr. and Mrs. 
Bud Coke; Mr, and Mrs. O. 
Henry Young, Abilene; Mr. 
and Mrs. Ronald Stringfellow; 
Mr. and Mrs, Jessie Stancell; 
Mrs. Opal Pursley; Mr. and 
Mrs. J. B. Murrell; Mr. and 
Mrs. Carson Clayton; Mr. and 
Mrs. Wayne Sturdevant; Mr. 
and Mrs. Buddy Sims; Mr. 
and Mrs. Orville Brantley.
Mr. and Mrs, Charlie Sparks, 
Hobbs, N.M.; Mr, and Mrs. 
Leonard Ratliff; Mr. and Mrs. 
Joyce Boen; and Eloise and 
Jimmy of Odessa; Mr, and 
Angelo; Mr. and Mrs. R. E. 
Mrs. Raymond Helms, San 
Newman, • Fort Worth; Mrs.
C. A. Ross; Hascal Sparks, 
Celeste; Mrs, Hattie Shanks, 
Woodson; Bro. and Mrs, Trott 
Stamford; and Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer Martin. Okla. City, 
Okla.

HERE FOR SAM WILEY 
FUNERAL SERVICE

Among out of town friends 
and relatives here for fun­
eral of Sam Whey included, 
Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Wiley, Mr, 
and Mrs. Don Wiley, Weldon 
andi Jerry David; Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Cormies and Rickey; 
Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Hatches! 
and Mark, all of Odessa; Mrs. 
Jewel Wiley, Levelland; Mrs. 
James Hughes and Blake and 
Mr, and Mrs. Odell Eaton and 
Janey Of Ft. Worth; Peggy 
Chandler, Amarillo; Kirby 
Gladys Adams, Colorado 
Adams, Espinola, N.M.; 
Springs, Colo., and Mr. and 
Mrs, Paul Foreman, Roby. 

Classified Ads Get Resuts!

Shop P A Y T O E  Save 2  Wavs
L E A N

Pork
Chops

B m m k %

Y o u n g  B i o o o  f  RLSH FROZEN Ctfl-UP
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fc -r /N

I ^ L * v

>NFW RED PCTTATOES
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GOLD BOND
__________ ____ . . .



PUBUC 
AUCTION
The following articles from high school build­

ing of Rotan School System will be auctioned
beginning

10:00 A.M. 
FRIDAY, JULY 26

13 CABINET SEWING MACHINES . -
(MOLD TYPE DESKS 
45 TABLE TYPE DESKS 
150 ARMLESS DESKS
20 AIRPLANE TYPE DOUBLE DESKS *
25 TABLES-r 3x6 LIBRARY 
105 BROAD TOP STUDENT DESKS 
3CABINETUNITS-SlNK:kludeslDispo8aI 
4-4x6 CONFERENCE TABLES 
2TABLES
4 TABLES -16 CHAIRS-Homemaliiiig 
1 Large TROPHY CASE 
1 BABY GRAND PIANO 
I MAPLE HUTCH-JAPLE TABLE 
6 CHAIRS -  Love Seat, Platform Rocker,

Step Table Lamp
SEVEL REFRIGERATOR 
IWESTiGHOUSE ELEC RANGE 
4 PIECES OF SLATE-3x4  
ELECTRIC PUMP 
1 DOUBLE SINK 
1--LDRAWER FILING CABMT  
1 WATER H E A T E -20 GaL 
ISCIECE DEM. TABLE-with Sink 
IBURGANDY VELVET STAGE CURTAIN 

AND MANY iS C . ITEMS
J. yi. Brewer, Auctioneer.

Kolb-Cabmpell
Reunion Held

On Saturday night, July 13 
and Sunday, July 14 the Kolb 
and Campbell Reunion was 
held at the Fire Boys Build­
ing in Roby.

There was visiting, singing, 
and string music. Among the 
friends helping out with en­
tertainment was Mr. and 
Mrs. J. P. Boyd and Mr. Wal­
ter Miers, all whom are very 
capable.

Those present were Mr. and 
Mrs. Doyle Grammage and 
sons Pat and Bobby, Wichita 
Falls; Mr. and Mrs. Keefer 
Cauble, Revis and Lois Ann; 
Mr. and Mrs. G. W. Joplin; 
Mr. and Mrs. J. D. McCor­
mick Jr.; Mr. Vernon Allan 
and son; Mrs. Alva Kolb, Sr.; 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon Helm, 
Debora, Patricia and Curtis 
all of Roby; Mr. Dow Boyd; 
Mrs. McCormck, Abilene; 
Walter Miers; Mr. and Mrs. 
Nash Miers; Mr. and Mrs. G. 
W. Crawford, Rebekah, Cheri- 
beth, and Mary Lynn; Mr. 
Mike Thornton; Mr. and Mrs. 
W. A. Clements; Miss Karen 
McKimmey; Mr. and Mrs. R.
D. Shows; Mr. and Mrs. J 
C. Cave; Mr. and Mrs. B. B. 
Crawford; Mrs. Era Boen; 
Mrs. Jackie Green of Rotan; 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Peters; 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Mc- 
Grew of Arlington; Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmo Kolb; Miss Luna 
Kolb, Sweetwater; Mrs. A.
E. Vice; Mrs. Marsha Gardner 
and Heath, Snyder; Mr. and 
Mrs. Ernest Kolb; Mr. Calvin 
Kolb; and Mr. and Mrs. Vir­
gil Kolb, Aspermont; Mr. and 
Mrs. C. E. Farr, Pasadena, 
Tex.; Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Y. 
Kolb; and Ronnie Kolb of El 
Paso; Mr. and Mrs. David 
Kolb; Mr. and Mrs. Leonard 
Ratliff, Sherry; Mr. and Mrs. 
Lloyd' Crawford; Mrs. Jewell 
K. Dacy; and Allan Kolb all 
of Odessa; Mrs. Joe P. Gaines

Mr. and Mrs. Homer Finch 
of Merkel visited her moth­
er, Mrs. Cora O’Neal Sunday 
and attended funeral services 
for his brother-in-law, Clyde 
Green.

with FRIGIDAIRE 
room air conditioning

3n_Tni~iJL»iĴ ~u>rLArir»~innnn—

Remember last summer’s sizzling hot, muggy 
weather? Remember how you suffered on your 
days at home,-and all through those long, long 
nights? W ell. . .  don’t swelter through another 
summer! One simple decision, and you’ve 
solved all the heat problems the FRIGIDAIRE 
electric refrigerated room cooler! The cost is so 
little. . .  from $3.00 to $5.00 a month for a half­
ton size, up to $9.00 to $15.00 a month for the 
luge one-and-a half ton size.

r ^

WEST TEXAS
AN m ViSTOR OWNED

Ask about the 
FREE

220 volt wiring

and Kathy, Hyattesville, 
Maryland; Charlotte and Lar­
ry Campbell, Sweetwater; 
Mr. and Mrs. Doc Hewitt, 
Chillicothe; Mr. and Mrs. A. 
N. Grammage, Elkhart, Tex.; 
Mr and Mrs. J. H. Smith, Ja­
son; Mr. and Mrs. Jay Blount 
and three sons, LaPorte, Tex; 
Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Marshall; 
Mrs. Marshall, Ovalo; Mr. 
and Mrs. Reed, Abilene; Mr. 
and Mrs. Sam Brewer Jr., and 
son Sam III o f California; 
Mrs. Iva Brewer; Mr. and 
Mrs. J. P. Boyd, McCaulley.

A very interesting item on 
display was the family Bible 
that belonged to Jonothan 
and Sarah Walston Kolb who 
were bom in Jackson County, 
Ga., married in Troup Coun­
ty, Ga., in 1834. They were 
the great-grandparents of EL 
met and his brothers and sis­
ters. This Bible was bought 
July 18th, 1835 from C. D. 
Pace in Georgia.

Another great-granddaugh­
ter, Mrs. R. J. Marshall has 
the Bible. It is treasured 
highly.

At the noon hour, a long 
table was spread with almost 
anything in the way of good 
food one might think of and 
there was plenty left for the 
supper meal which a lot of 
the group stayed over and ate 
together

The Reunion will be held 
in Rotan at the Community 
Center on Saturday night and 
Sunday following the 4th of 
July in 1969. They hope to 
have more in number in the 
next Reunion.

G. W. Crawford was elect­
ed president for 1969.

Howard Campbell, vice- 
president; Mrs. Leonard Rat­
liff, Sec.-Treasurer and Re­
porter; all for 1969.

COUNTY
AGENT

Drills, saws, sanders, and 
other elecric hand tools are 
convenient and useful devi­
ces, but they can also be 
dangerous if used carelessly.

Such tools must be positi­
vely grounded for safe use as 
the ordinary voltages that 
power them can foe fatal. If 
an ungrounded tool is used, 
its frame can become charged, 
and the current could go 
through the operator’s body 
to the grounded surface he 
happens to be touching. This 
could be any mineral surface 
Upon which he is standing, or 
any metal he touches.

Your safety is worth taking 
the time to check your tools 
to make sure that the frames 
aren’t being charged. Water 
on the trigger switch, carbon 
from motor brushes, or brok­
en or loose parts inside a mot­
or case o f the trigger switch, 
can all cause trouble. So can 
loose cord connections or 
worn or defective cords.

A three-wired cord and a 
three pronged-plug should be 
a part o f every electric hand'- 
tool you ©wn or use. The third 
wire is used only as a ground 
to provide a better path for 
the current instead of through 
your body. Remember that 
the outlet must also be 
grounded. Otherwise, the 
ground wire remains uncon­
nected.

NEWS
by Richard Spencer

ducton throughout the sum­
mer and fall, don’t neglect 
your rose bushes. Continue 
to use a disease and insect 
control program^ A preven­
tive spray of folpet every 7 
to 10 days will prevent black- 
spot and help control mildew.

An application of complete 
fertilizer scatteded over the 
surface of the rose bed at the 
rate of one to two pounds 
of 10-8-6 or 16-29-0 per 100 
square feet of bed area every 
four weeks will, insure contn- 
ued growth and strong canes 
for late summer and fall 
bloom.

To conserve moisture and 
reduce soil temperatures; the 
use of two to three inch muL 
ch of sawdust, shavings, pine 
straw, cotton burrs or other 
organic matter will help a 
great deal. As the mulch 
decomposes, is should be re­
placed.

Avoid mowing wet grass 
whenever possible. Dry grass 
cuts easier, does not ball up 
and clog the mower and gives 
a more finished appearance 
to the lawn.

It isn’t necessary to throw 
away those extra flower and 
vegetable seeds left from 
spmg plantings. If proper­
ly cared for, many seed can 
be held over for next season 
use with very little loss of 
germination and plant vigor. 
Seeds to be held over for next 
year’s use should be air dry 
and placed in glass jars with 
air tight lids. The sealed 
jars should be kept where the 
temperature will range from 
35 to 55 degrees F. A re­
frigerator or cool basement 
are the most satisfactory 
places to meet these require- 
menth.

For longer lasting cut 
flowers, cut them in the late 
afternoon or early evening. 
Avoid collecting them dur- 
ng the heat of the day. Place 
freshly cut flowers in a con- 
taner of warm water and 
place in a draft free place 
until the water cools to room 
temperaure. Flowers are then 
ready to use in any arrange­
ment.

For continued flower pro-

Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Whitley 
spent the weekend here with 
his mother, Mrs. Donna Whit­
ley and other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. John Cleve­
land and daughters of Fort 
Stockton visited his mother, 
Mrs. Sam Cleveland and Miss 
Bessie and her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Roy Donham at 
Roby.

Classified Ads Get Resuts!

UTILITIEI
CUECTRtC COMPANYirtttnUy tmatOTT,

YOUNG’S
FOOD

VALUES
FROZAN
KOOL-AID
LETTUCE
MORTON’S

TEA
HOMINY
MAXWELL HOUSE

COFFEE

igal. 39c 
6Pkgs. 25c 

keaj 23c
Mb. 59c

NO 21/2 CANS

2 for &

SWIFT’S

(SHORTENING 3 lb. can 59c
f ALL MEAT

FRANKS 12oz.pkg. 39c 
PORK STEAK 
CHUCK STEAK
YOUNG’S MARKET

ijEXirir’b-iirininrirÊn ~‘i"~ ̂  --- ---------------------------



Burk
H

GROCERY & MARKET

VINE RIPE

YELLOW

TRAIL FANCY

M ' J i

DOGFOOD
1 0  r t U O

SOKE BETTER

W HITE ROSE

POTATOES
1  O w G B c

KOBETS
SHOESTRING

POTATOES
Gallon 
Can I 
O n l y . ' ! . . . .

' EXTRA SPECIAL

BABY FOOD

GLADIOLA

25 Pound 
Sack



Mother of Mrs. Brother of E. H. 
Miers Dies \Inrnhow Dies

Mrs. C. P. (Laura U.) | Melvin Tumbow, 67, died 
Yates, 83, passed away July | at 11 p.m. Thursday in the 
18 at Hamlin. Bern April 25, i Haskell Memorial Hospital,
1885 at Albany, she was the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Clay Haskew.

In November of 1901 she

where he had been a patient 
for 11 days. He had been in 
ill health about two years. 

He was brother of E. H.
and Clarence Yates were [ Turnbow of Rotan. 
married at Rayner, in Stone- Funeral service was held
wall County. He died in 1965.

Mrs. Yates was a longtime 
member of the Methodist 
Church, McCaulley and later 
Hamlin. She belonged to the

Sunday at 2 p.:m. in First 
Baptist Church in Haskell, 
with burial in Willow ceme­
tery.

Born Sept. 8, 1900. near
Eastern Star for over (fifty  ̂Arlington, Tex., he came to
years.

Funeral was held at 10 
a.m. Saturday in United 
First Methodist Church with 
Rev, Cecil Hardaway,' pastor, 
officiating. Burial in Anson 
Cemetery under direction of 
Foster Funeral Home.

She had lived with her son 
in Hamlin since the death of 
her husband.

Survivors include a son, 
Lewis C. of Hamlin; A dau­
ghter, Mrs. N. D. (Bessie L.) 
Miers of Hobbs; two grand­
children and two great-grand 
children.

DON SMITHS’ LIVING 
IN CHICAGO ILL.

Don A. Smith, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard Smith, gra- 
dua;(ed from Texas Technolo­
g i c  College July 12.^Don has 
achieved the degree of*Bache- 
lor of Business Admihisftra- 
tion in Transportation IViaî -i' 
agement. He and his wife 
Dawn are now residing in 
Chicago, Illinois. Don is em­
ployed by Hart Schaffner and 
Marx as manager of trans-

Haskell County in 1906 with 
his parents, and settled near 
Scott’s Crossing. Then he 
lived in Rule, Rochester and 
Jud before his marriage Sept. 
16, 1922 to Mae Bell Wheeler, 
in Haskell.

They have lived here since 
he worked for the Texas 
Highway Department for 25 
years before his retirement in 
1965. He was a member of 
the First Baptist Church here.

Survivors are his wife, five 
daughters, three sons, his 
mother, Mrs. Sam Turnbow 
of Rotan; one sister, 14 grand­
children and 2 great grand­
children.

Mr. and Mrs. E. H. Tum­
bow and Mr, and Mrs. Glen 
Odom and children of Rotan 
attended funeral service.

Service Held For 
Former Resident

Funeral service for Mack 
Henry Coleman, former resi­
dent of Rotan, who had lived 
in Midland since end of WWII 
was held from Weathersbee 
Chapel Wednesday at 2 p. 
m, by Rev. F. K. Williams.

Mr Coleman died in Veter­
ans Hospital in Big Spring, 
Tuesday at 5 a. m.

He was born March 20, 19- 
11 at Center, Texas, came to 
Fisher County in 1932, and 
was ^  member of the Baptist 
Church.

Burial was in Belview cem­
etery under direction of 
Weathersbee Funeral Home, 
with H. Govan, Charles Irving 
John Pearson, Cliff Collins, 
Mack Bennett, Columbus 
Carr, William Franklin and 
Carl Huitt as pall bearers.

Survivors are 2 half-broth­
ers, John Neighbors of Rotan 
and N. N. Neighbors of Dal­
las.

Mrs. Morris Watson .. enter-' 
ed West Texas Hospital, room 
502, Lubbock; Friday after­
noon for a few days treat­
ment. Mr. Watson and two 
grandchildren, Janet and QU 
Watson accompanied her and
the children left Lubbock by 

portation and communication, j plane for their home in Vien- 
The Smiths are former resi-ina, Va., Sunday. The children 
dents of Rotan. The family had been visiting relatives in 
moved to Lubbock in 1957.1 Texas about 3 weeks.

Mr. and Mrs. Bart Stray- 
horn went to Hurst Thursday 
in response to a message that 
a friend, Mrs. Bob Street had 
died suddenly Wednesday 
morning of a cerebral hem- 
orrage. Mrs. Strayhom and 
Mrs. Street were life-long 
friends, attended school in 
Mason and attended college 
together. Mr. ^̂ ând Mrs. 
Strayhorn also werit to Mason 
for funeraL services^mnd’ bur­
ial., rettirping .home Friday 
eveningl '

,T.;R̂ r. ^ d  Mrs. Hill G. Smith 
Mike and Brad of Lewisville 
spent a week here, with their 
parents Mr. and Mrs. Worth 
Smith. While here they re­
paired and painted the Smith 
home returning home Snuday.

TURNBULL REUNION 1
HELD LAST WEEKEND '

Attending the Turnbull Re­
union Saturday and Sunday, 
July 20 and 21 were Mr. and 
Mrs. J. E. Turnbull, Jean and 
Sheri, Olney; Mi. and Mrs.. 
Lee Everheart, San Angelo; 
Mr. and Mrs. Rodney Turn- 
bull and Rodney Lee; Mr. and 
Mrs. C. T. Turnbull, Abilene; 
Mr. and Mrs  ̂Hardy Turnbull, 
Lisa, Jeff and Janson, Hobbs, 
N.M.; Mr. and Mrs. D. F. 
Hones, Tahoka; Mr. and M^s. 
Archie Turnbull, Almogordo, 
N.M.; Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Lichey, Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
White, Wilson, Tex.; Mr. and 
Mrs. David Klepper and 
Frankie, Mr. and Mrs. Lester 
Greenway, Jay Brian and 
Lance; Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Mc­
Cullough, Rotan; Mr. and 
Mrs. Vemie MeWhirter, Alesa 
and Luanne; Mrs. E. C. Me­
Whirter, Pearland, Tex.; Mrs. 
Earl Houston, Lamesa; Mr, 
and Mrs. W. E. Edwards; Mr. 
and Mrs. Jess Goforth and 
Allen; Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Pal­
mer and Brent; Mrs. Mamie 
Moulton, Roby; Mrs. George 
Houldon, Big Spring; Mr. and 
Mrs. Archie Edwards, Donnie 
Dwain and Denise, Midland; 
Mrs. J. R. Whitmire, Johnnie, 
Mark and Penny, Laredo; Mr. 
and Mrs. Tommy Edwards, 
Rhonda Jay and Lee Ann, 
Monahans; Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Gilbert, Corpus Christi; Eilene 
Turnbull, Grisham and Clark, 
Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. John 
C. Fryburger, Vanessa and 
Brian, Seminole.

Mrs. Sam Cleveland and 
Miss Bessie visited Mrs. Clev­
eland’s sister, Mrs. Jay Clev­
eland in Golden Oak Nursing 
Home in Brownwood Tues­
day. Mrs. Cleveland has 
been a resident of the home 
for several days.

T.V. Cable Service Is Here!!

Cable Electronics Installers are making connections as rap­
idly as possible

f.

WE ARE E X T E S P m  OVR CONSTRVCTIOH SPECIAL 
THROUGH JULY Jlst OHLYll

■A-

Order your Cable Connection now dnd save. Until July 31st you 
receive FREE installation and 2 full months service for a total 
cost of only -- a riegg/ar $21.85 value for inst $5.95

There is no contract to sign -  so dont delay, take advantage of 
the construction special NOW! On the Cable you receive:

Channel No. 2 -  
Channel No. 4 
Channel No. 5 -  
ChannelNo. 8 -  
Channel No. 11 - 
Channel No. 13 - 
Channel No. 13 -

■ Rotan Weather and FM Music 
-K R B C -T V -N B C  
-K T X S -T V -C B S
■ W F A A -T V -A B C  
KTVT-TV-Independent

■ KERA-TV -  Educational 
K R LD -T V -C B S (Weekends)

For Sale 128.4 a. located 6 
miles east of Roby. Ade­
quate, good quality, irriga­
tion water to care for 85 a. 
Coastal Bermuda. 3,159 ft. 
underground pipe; 1,510 ft. 
of 5” aluminum pipe; 2,350 
ft of 4” sprinkler line; 30,000 
gallon regulating reservoir of 
steel and concrete. Good 
fences and 4 room modern 
house. Water is 38 to 41 ft. 
deep. Price $400 acre in­
cluding all equipment. Bruce 
Cox, ph. 735-2808, Rotan.

Big Blue Carmen Grapes, 
50c gallon, $3.50 bushel, Mrs 
E. L. Yeats, Roby.

For Sale, 2 outside doors 
with jams and screens; two 
double windows; 2 single 
windows, contact Mac 
Weathersbee, 735-2255. 22-3t

For Sale my home at 904 
Johnson, R. M. Donham, con­
tact me at P&D Jewelry or 
at my home., R. M. Donahoo.

For Sale New Crop NK-37 
Bermuda Hay, W- G. Hardy, 
phone Roby 776-2647. 18-tfc

For Sale or trade, 2 corner 
lots, 5th and Cleveland; 2 
corner lots, McKinley and 6th 
2 houses, corner 6th and Ty­
ler; 2 houses, 207 E Lee; 
House and 2 lots, comer 
Beaugard and Genevieve, 3 
lots, comer Tyler and 7th. 
Juston Morrow, Rotan. 16.

Good hot Bar-B-Que at 
Moses York,, located behind 
POirter’s Locker.
FOR SALE: 3 Bedroom House 
to be moved. Excellent Con­
dition. phone 735-3070.. 

Irene Rains it-tfc
. GROCERY STORE For Bale 
we would like to retire. Buy 
Stock at cost—Pay for, fix­
tures and building by month. 

George Moore Gro 17-tfc

For Sale, Used Refrigera­
tors, Ranges, and Washing 
Machines - Home Lumber 
Company.

For Sale, weaning pigs, 
Gartman’s Shamrock Sta­
tion. 48-tfc
KEEP your carpets beautiful 
despite constant footsteps of 
a busy family. Get Blue Lus­
tre. Rent electric shampooer 
$1. Landes Furniture.

For Sale, Used Refrigera­
tors, Ranges, and Washing 
Machines —  Home Lumber 
Company.

For Rent, good house close 
in, in good condiition, Mrs. 
Ruth Denton, ph. 735-3096.

24-4tp
For Rent, furnished brick 

apartment, bills paid, Mrsi 
Inzer Whitefield, phone 735- 
2328. 23-tfc

40 ft. Trailer for Cattle, and 
general hauling. James A. 
Clark Jr. box 88, Aspremont. 
ph. 4046. l-tfc

Mr. and Mrs. Palmer Hunt 
and two children of Tulsa, 
Okla., spent the weekend 
here with her sister, Mrs. L. 
A. Brown and Mr. Brown.

CARD OF THANKS
The family of Sam Wiley 

wishes to express sincere ap­
preciation for the help, kind­
ness, lovely flowers, food and 
visits during the loss of our 
father, grandfather and great 
grandfather. Especially to 
Rev. Jackie Barnett.

Mrs. Emma Howard and 
family

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Wiley 
and family 

Mrs. Ebb Wiley and families

Fresh, frisky Minnows, 
inquire at Moore Grocery or 
1 block north Post Office.

14-tfc

Bring your alterations to 
me now before school starts 
again. Mrs. Joe Taggart, 103 
E B urnside 22-4tc
DON’T merely brighten your
carpets----- Blue Lustre them

. . .  eliminate rapid resoiling. 
Rent electric shampooer $1. 
Winn’s Store.

For Rent, furnished 1 bed­
room house, all modem appli­
ances, air conditioner, with 
utilities paid, see at 502 E. 
Johnson or Modesto Yanez 
at Rotan Seed Delinting 
Co. 2 l-tfc

ARKANSAS SHINERS— 
lively, that will catch fish 
Trot line and regular size. Al­
so some tackle. R. T. Shipp 
810 N. Florence. 50-52tp

Monuments and Cemetery 
Curbing, 308 E 4th St. phone 
735-3290. J. B. Smith 2l-tfc

of
ROTAN

-  Phone 7 3 5 -2 6 £ e ^  735-2231

r%

•w
* $5.95 per month for T  dfinSir-------$I Same t|oiisehol(d only#

V.. -;

Classified Ads Get Results!

We are looking for a good 
Ford Tractor mechanic. If you 
don’t know Ford Tractors an<̂  
Equ ipment, don’t apply. Fisb-̂  
c'r County Tractor Co.

CARD OF THANKS
The family of Clyde Green 

wishes to express its heart­
felt appreciation for the many 
kind expressions of sympathy 
extended to us. We wish to 
thank especially Dr. Johnson 
and the hospital staff and the 
Weathersbee boys for their 
many thoughtful considera­
tions. The words of comfort, 
the prayers, the lovely flow­
ers, the food, and all the 
many other acts of thought­
fulness have helped us to 
bear our loss more easily. 
Thank you all and may God 
bless you.

Mrs. Clyde Green 
Mr. and Mrs. Leon House 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Green 
Mrs. Ray Green and Cathy

DONHAM REUNION
The Donham reunion was 

held at Roby Saturday night 
and Sunday.

The event was in honor o f  
Mr. Sam Donham of Fisher 
County Nursing Home who 
celebrated his 83rd birthday 
Sunday, when a large white 
iced cake, decorated with red 
roses was served with punch 
to the guests.

Children from out of state; 
attending were Mrs. Nettie 
Mahaffey of Fresno, Calif., 
S. T. Donham, Tima, Ariz., 
Dewey Donham of Hamlin, 
Buster Donham and Mrs. 
Charlie Messick of Rotan.

Grandchildren came from 
Del Rio, Pampa, Lubbock, 
Abilene, Anson, Roby, Rotan, 
Sweetwater and Freeport, 
and a host of friends. More 
than 125 attended each day.

The happy occasion saw 
lots of food and much visit­
ing.

CHRISTIAN^-SCIENCE 
SUNDAY SEkVlCjE:

“Ye shall know th^itruth, 
and the truth shall make you 
free.” These words of Jesus 
as recorded in the Gospel of 
John, are part of the Lesson- 
Sermon titled “Truth” to be 
read in Christian Science 
churches this Sunday.

Among related passages to 
be read from the denomina­
tional textbook, ‘Science and 
Health with Key to the Scrip­
tures”  by Mary Baker Eddy, 
is this: “We classify disease 
as error, which nothing but 
Truth or Mind can heal, and 
this Mind must be divine, not 
human.”

Services at 1001 Crane St., 
Sweetwater, begin at 11 o’­
clock. All are welcome.

Mri and Mrs. David Klep­
per III of Midland spent Sat­
urday night here with his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. David 
Klepped Jr.

Mrs. J. W. Porter arrived 
home Saturday night from a 
two months visit with her 
children, Mrs. Mildred Cas­
teel and Mr. and Mrs. B. W. 
Porter of Glen Dale, Calif. 
She returned to Rotan with 
two nieces, Mrs. Stanley 
Jones of Pittsburg, Calif., and 
Mrs. Bob Kinkier of Hay­
wood, Calif., who came to 
visit their mother, Mrs. Sam 
Adgms â hd their sister, Mrs. 
Lavefa Riley.

Mr. and Mrs, Raymond Alls 
accompanied-'their son, Pfc, . 
Richard Alls to Abilene SunLv 
daĵ  and he left to return td̂ J 
his base after a three weekfS 
leave here with his parents. 
He is scheduled to go to Viet 
Nam, July 25th.

Relatives visiting in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Hugh 
Huckaby recently were their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs, Hom­
er Ivey of Houston; a nephew 
Mr. and Mrs. Neil Weems and 
family from Las Cruses, New 
Mexico.

G. W. Finch, Mrs. Glen 
Avants and Mr. and Mrs. Lee 
Everheart of San Angelo at­
tended the Turnbull reunion 
at Roby and funeral service 
for Clyde Green.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Hill 
and daughter o f Big Spring 
visited in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs, Raymond Alls Sat­
urday night and Sunday.

FISHER COUNTY 
TRACTOR CO,

is ready to serve you with Ford 
parts and some equipment

We pldn to have our service de­
partment open to serve you in 
the very near future, and will 

advertise when it is ready.

L. D. Bilberry and Sherman 
of Post spent Sunday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Kike Beauch- 
ajnp.

i .. :■
^4 r̂s;r Mai^^i^v Cooper, 

Ddyid Cooper :o f  Big Spring 
and. =‘ M^. EafI Keese of 
Stamford visited Mr§. Emp­
ress Day last weekend.

N O TIC E
PLEASE PICK UP ALL 
WATCH and JEWELRY 

REPAIRS BEFORE
SATURDAY, JULY 27

/IS WE ARE CLOSING THE 
STORE AT THAT TIME
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Weems Reuinon 
Draws Crowd

One hundred and twenty- 
two decendents and friends 
o f the late Mr. and Mrs. A. 
■Weems met at "YEW Hall 
Simday, July 14 for their an­
nual get-to-gether in reunion 
and wonderful meal was serv­
ed.

Major Ray McKisson of Ft. 
Hood gave the invocation, 
with the folowing present, 
Mr. and Mrs. L. R. Weems, 
Mrs. Pearl Masters, Mr. and 
Mrs. Claude Weems, Mrs. Ella 
"Vaughan, Mr. and Mrs. Guy 
E Weems, Tom Ramby, Ru- 
ple Weems, Mr. and Mrs. Ber­
nard Weems and 2 children, 
Mrs. Drudie Ogden, Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Weems, Mr. and 
Mrs. Virgil Weems and 3 dau­
ghters, Haskell Templeton, 
Ann Allen and Charlie Seaton 
all of 'Rotan.

Mr. and Mrs. Emmett 
Weems, Mr. and Mrs. Alton 
Weems and 2 children, of 
Stephenville. From Snyder,

Wenona Jones', Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Burk, Mr. and Mrs. Will- 
ian Masters and 2 children, 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles Masters 
and 3 children.

Mrs. Estelle Weems, Oma 
Lois McFaul, Mr. and Mrs. H. 
B. Thompson, of Sweetwater.

From Lubbock, Violet 
i Smpson, Eldon G. Shreve and 
4 children, John Crofton.

Mr. and Mrs. Jesse Weems, 
Mr. and Mrs. E. D. Shreve, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Shreve and 
2 children, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Perkins, San Antonio.

Ronnie 'White, Corpus 
Christi. Mrs. C. F. Ware 
and 4 children. Lake Land, 
Florda. Mr. and Mrs. Edwin 
A Weems, Fort Worth. Mrs. 
Estelle Mize, Brownfield.

From Roby, Mr. and Mrs. 
H. C. Bettis, Mr. and Mrs. L. 
B, Boyd, Mr, and Mrs. Jack 
Cox and 2 children and Mr. 
and Mrs. J. B. Shreve.

Lynn Young of Clyde; Alta 
Fern Hudson and 2 children, 
of Happy; Mrs. and Mrs. L. 
L. Reger, Dickens.

Mr. and Mrs. Rob Ramby,

wmamm
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OIIAt lUILESON

Washington, D. C. — San 
Antonio’s HemsFair is more 
than just San Antonio’s. It is 
Texas’, the Nation, the West­
ern Hemisphere’s and the 
World’s.

By reason of it having been 
approved by the International 
Exposition Headquarters in 
Paris, it is international.

It is most impressive in all 
the ways that fairs may im­
press people but it makes im­
pressions in more simple 
terms.

Some of those who are not 
Texans and lacking in bias.

Mrs. Ehel Ramby, Tyne Per­
kins of Abilene.

Major and Mrs. Raymond 
E. McKisson, KUeen; Mr. and 
Mrs. W. J. Rogers, Clovis N. 
M.; Claig Casney, Hobbs, N. 
M.; Mr. and Mrs. Clayton 
Weems, Brenda Heston of 
Crosbyton; Glenda Box and 
on, San Angelo.

From Mineral Wells, Mrs. 
Jimmie Tuggle and 2 children, 
Mr. and Mrs. E. D. Shreve, 
and Mr. and Mrs. John Shreve 
and 2 children

The group pans to meet 
next year on second Sunday 
in July at Community Cen­
ter.

227 sq in. Rectangular 
Picture

Our lowest mice ever

'4 9 9 1
20” Maple Console

Zenith
\Automatic Fine-tuning Controi

electronically fine tunes color tv instantly-^ 
even perfects your UHF fine-tuning 

—automatically!

Super Gold 
Video Guard Tuner

with gold contacts for 
longer TV life!

HANDCRAFTED 
COLOR CHASSIS

No printed circuits!

Sunshine"
Picture Tube with rare 

earth phosphor for greater 
picture brightness

Moving to 
New Location

W e will move to our new location 213 W . Snyder Ave., 
Rotan, August 1st.
SPECIAL LOW  PRICES ON ALL T .V .’s, RADIO’S and 

STEREO’S until AUGUST 1st.

Bill & Gene's T.V. Service
. pliene 725-2321

which those of us from Texas 
may have, are quick to com­
ment upon the orderlinests, 
its cleanliness, its courtesy, 
its lack of ballyhoo, which 
might otherwise be expected.

There is, however, one 
critical note. It has come un­
der attack from numerous 
sources. It is the controversy 
of the film “ Confluence USA” 
at the United States Pavilion. 
"What does that mean? A com­
ing together of peoples, a 
joining of forces— everything, 
nothing - but officials of the 
Department of Ccwnmerce, 
the Agency under whose jur­
isdiction comes exhibitions, 
fairs and expositions, say 
that “world’s fair films are 
not suppose to mean, they are 
suppose to be, like laughter or 
morning dew.” When Mrs. 
Lyndon Johnson saw the film 
she is quoted as saying “ It 
lacks the element of hope.” 
Former Ambassador Ed 
Clark, now Commissioner of 
the United States Pavilion at 
HemisFair, said “ They had to 
pack up a thousand good 
things in America to find one 
of its bad things to show.”

Not all officials of our Gov­
ernment nor our citizens 
think it is bad. Some view it 
as a great film that just 
sweeps down on you and says 
“ Look America—Look what 
you are doing to yourself.” 
At a bend in the corridor on 
leaving the theatre, you see 
yourself on television with 
the caption “Are you a part 
of the problem?” and at the 
next turn another television 
picture of yourself above 
which is “Are you a pyart of 
the solution?”

This comes about because 
after the film has shown 
many wonders of the United 
States—its great productive 
capacity, its beauties of na 
ture, its enterprising people, 
its great flowing rivers and 
lakes, majestic peaks, waving 
fields of grain to feed mil­
lions in the world, its pulsing 
industry — comes the seamy 
side. It shows hunder and 
want, poor people and the 
disadvantaged, streams pol­
luted by the refuse of our in­
dustrial plants, as well as the 
air from automobiles and 
smokestacks. It shows dead 
automobiles covering acres in 
junkyards; a newly married 
couple spend most of the day 
and night stuck in a freeway 
raffic jam in some great city.

The controversy, simply 
stated, is why show the bad 
or “ seamy” side of America 
and does it mean that to not 
show it is a denial it exists

Several years ago, when 
Edgar R. Murrow was ap­
pointed Director of the Unit­
ed States Information Agency 
for our Government’s propa­
ganda overseas, he introduc­
ed the idea that we should 
portray America exactly as 
it is to foreign peoples. When 
questioned on this policy his 
reply was that we must not 
deny to foreigners that we do 
not have problems and that 
to honestly reveal them 
would be greater cause for 
them to believe the good 
things. Many of us disagree 
and questioned him at length.

A good salesman never 
says “You don’t want to buy 
any of this, do you?” He ex­
tols the virtues of his pro­
duct. Advertising people try 
to put in words, music or pic­
tures the merits of what they 
are trying to sell to make 
people want to buy.

To withhold the seamy side 
of America is not to deny we 
have a lot of it. But the point 
is that by portraying the 
best, it emphasizes the sys­
tem of Government which is 
able to produce more things 
for more people and where 
people are better off than any 
other place on the face of the 
earth.

It is not so important that 
we have more automobiles, 
more telephones, bathtubs, 
television sets and just about 
everything else than all the 
rest of the world put togeth­
er. It is important to sell the 
idea that a free democratic 
society and a free enterprise 
system, made possible these 
wondrous accomplishments. 
It does not mean that our 
Nation is perfect but like in­
dividuals, we work toward 
perfection.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Brine- 
gar and daughters of Midland 
visited her parents Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Ashton. They were 
on vacaton to Hemisfair and 
visited here enroute home.

Social Security 
Information

Marvin and Lorene Clark 
have found it pays to read 
the Rotan Advance. Mr. Clark 
recently read an article in 
the Advance about what you 
should bring with you when 
you file for social security. 
The article had suggested that 
employees bring their last 
year’s W-2 form and proof of 
their age. It also suggested 
they file their application 
three months before they re­
tire. Another article in the 
Advance suggested that ail 
people bom in Texas in 1903 
or later write to Austin to 
see if they had a birth certifi­
cate as the state has a record 
of most births since that time. 
Mr. Clark wrote to the Bu­
reau of 'Vital Statistics in 
Austin and found he did have 
a birth certificate. He had 
always assumed he did not 
have one.

On June 25, he met with 
"Wayne Baker, social security 
representative for Fisher

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Clev­
eland and children of Corpus 
Christi spent several days 
here with his mother, Mrs. 
Sam Cleveland and Miss Bes­
sie.

Mrs. Earl Holcomb return­
ed home Sunday from St. 
Ann’s Hospital in Abilene 
where she recently had eye 
surgery. She is reported to 
be doing nicely.

County and filed his applica­
tion. Mrs. Clark also filed her 
application for wife’s bene­
fits but did not need to fur­
nish any additional age proof 
as she was already on the so­
cial security rolls. As a result 
of reading the paper and fol­
lowing the suggestions, Mr. 
and Mrs. Clark were assured 
by Baker that they would re­
ceive their first check on 
time. Filing ahead of time al­
lows the social security of­
fice to work out any prob­
lems which could arise and 
still get the first check out on 
time.

WHAT IS CONSERVATION?
Webster defines conserva­

tion as the official care and 
protection of natural resourc­
es. Now that you know what 
conservation means, ask 
yourself these questions: How 
much water do I waste each 
day? How much soil is lost in 
my yard or field because of 
improper care? How may I, 
as a citizen of my state, help?

The answers to some of 
these questions are: First,
you should “ read up” on 
these problems; Second, you 
should go see the Soil Con­
servation Service, which has 
the knowledge and experi­
ence to help you; Third, you 
shoud follow their advice.

Conservation does not only 
effect you now, but it effects 
your children and grandchild­
ren. One hundred years from 
now, there might not be any 
oil or good soil. They would 
be dependent on other na­
tions. Conservation is a con­
tinuing job that will last as 
long as man cares for his re­
sources.
—Written by Ruple Weems 
for a Boy Scout Merit Badge.

W ill your air conditioning turn your hom e 
into a pressure cooker this summer?

A breakdown on a typical summer 
day could accomplish just that! 
That’s why you ought to consider 
gas air conditioning right now! It’s 
buik to be relied on. Gas air con­
ditioning is built simply, ruggedly, 
with no compressor, fewer moving 
parts. That means less things to go 
wrong . . . and added years o f  
dependable service and comfort.

Call Lone Star Gas for a free 
estimate on reliable gas air con­
ditioning. 6

Lone Star Gas

SUMMER
C LEA R A N C E

LAST CHANCE A T  THESE SPECIALS 
Ladies

Summer Dresses % price
OFF ON

Sports Wear and Swim Wear.
All Summer Bags

M ens Walking Shorts, Straw Hats, Swim Wear. 
B oys and Girl’s Summer Shirts, Swim Wear.
SEE OUR PIECE GOODS BARGAIN TABLE 

TABLEOFSHOES - - - - $ 4  
CANVAS SHOES - ■ ■ ■ ? 2  
TABLE OF SUMMER SHOES - - $ 2

FOR SATURDAY ONLY 
DOUBLE KNIT - - - yd. $ 4

Darden Dept. 
Store

CASH ONLY, NO L A Y -A -W A Y S PLEASE, ON SALE  
MERCHANDISE AND NO STAM PS


