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Absentee Voting Closes Friday
Absentee voting will be open 

through Friday in the office of 
County and District Clerk Bess 
McWilliams for the Democratic 
and Republican Primaries to be 
held Tuesday, March 8.

Polls will be open from 7:00 
a.m. until 7:00 p.m. Tuesday. 
Briscoe County Republicans will 
vote at one precinct, in the home 
of Diamond Williams, 201 North 
Loretta in Silverton.

Democratic voting places will 
be the City Hall in Silverton, 
Precinct 1; the City Hall in 
Quitaque, Precinct 2; Pioneer 
Room at First State Bank in 
Silverton, Precinct 3; Verlin 
Towe Office Building in Silver- 
ton, Precinct 4; Mackenzie Muni­
cipal Water Authority Office,

All Briscoe County residents 
are invited to a Citizens Forum 
on Monday, March 7, from 7:30 to 
9:00 p.m. in the Pioneer Room at 
First State Bank in Silverton.

The twelve candidates who 
will be on the county ballot for 
the Super Tuesday primary on 
March 8, are being contacted and 
invited to participate. The pur­
pose of this forum is to provide 
voters an opportunity to hear the 
candidates’ views in order to be 
better equipped to make inform­
ed choices at the polls.

Those running for office are in 
positions of leadership and deci­
sion-making in the county gov­
ernment. Citizens should wel­
come this opportunity to exercise 
their rights to be involved in the 
election process and determine

Each voter of the Democratic 
Party is welcomed and urged to 
attend their respective Democra­
tic Party Precinct Convention on 
Election evening, March 8, 1988 
at 7:15 p.m. in your polling place.

“This is a most important 
caucus for the purpose of record­
ing the heartbeat of Briscoe 
County to the state and national 
levels of the Democratic Party,” 
said Jackie Mercer, County 
Chairman of the Democratic 
Party. “Please get yourself invol­
ved and attend this convention 
with careful consideration and 
much love for your life in our 
great country and your plans, 
hopes and dreams for our ‘corner 
of the world’.

Precinct 5.
Sample ballots are provided 

elsewhere in this issue of your 
hometown newspaper. The 
sample ballot for the Democratic 
Primary is not the actual ballot 
for any one precinct, but shows 
the candidates for County Com­
missioner in both Precincts 1 and 
3.

There are no write-in votes for 
either primary, except that the 
Republicans will be writing in a 
County Chairman and the Demo­
crats will be writing in a County 
Chairman and a Precinct Chair­
man in each of the four Commis­
sioners’ precincts.

All candidates for county of­
fices have filed for the Democra­
tic Primary. The primaries nom-

how the candidates stand on 
significant issues pertaining to 
Briscoe County.

The Family Community Lead­
ership team of Jackie Mercer, 
Virginia Hardin and Lynda Fog- 
erson are conducting the Forum 
as a part of community leader­
ship training to help citizens be 
informed voters. The FCL pro­
ject is an educational program of 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service and the Texas 
Extension Homemakers Associa­
tion.

Voters are reminded that 
county officials make decisions 
that influence the entire county, 
not just one precinct. Plan to 
attend and hear all the candi­
dates.

“Any qualified Democratic vot­
er 18 years of age or older who 
resides in the precinct where the 
Convention will be held and who 
has voted in the Democratic 
Primary Election, whether ab­
sentee or in person, shall be 
eligible to attend, to participate 
in, and to be a candidate for any 
Party Office or for any Delegate 
or Alternate position to be filled 
at the County Convention.

“Support your ideals! Support 
your precinct! Support your 
Democratic Party and attend 
your Precinct Convention!

“Attend your caucus on Elec­
tion evening, March 8, 1988, at 
7:15 p.m. in your polling place!” 
Mrs. Mercer concluded.

inate candidates for the general 
election, but for all practical 
purposes the county-level candi­
dates consider themselves elect­
ed following the primaries due to 
having no opponents listed on the 
Republican ballot.

The terms of office of Shafe 
Weaver, Commissioner of Pre­
cinct 1, and Beryl Long, Commis­
sioner of Precinct 3, are expiring 
at the end of this year. Neither 
has filed for re-election.

In Precinct 1, the candidates 
for Commissioner are Alton 
(Tobe) Riddell, Eddie Rhoderick 
and Aaron Younger. In Precinct 
3, the candidates are Larry 
Comer, John T. Francis and L. B. 
Garvin, jr.

Another contested race is that 
of the County Tax Assessor-Col­
lector, where the incumbent 
Fairy McWilliams is being oppos­
ed by Waynelle Couch and Gloria 
Wood.

The other county officers are 
unopposed in their bids for 
re-election.

Kindergarten To 
Have Kite 
Flying Contest

The kindergarten class has 
just completed a unit on air. For 
Public Schools Week, weather 
permitting, they will have a Kite 
Flying Contest as a follow-up 
activity.

At 11:20 a.m. Thursday, March 
10, the kindergarten and their 
parents will have a picnic on the 
football field with everyone 
bringing a sack lunch.

The Kite Flying Contest will 
be from 11:45 until 12:15. Cate­
gories will be The Highest Flyer, 
Most Beautiful, Most Unusual, 
The One That Stays Up Longest 
and The Most Stubborn.

Immunization Clinic 
To Be Held Here 
Thursday, March 24

An immunization clinic offer­
ing vaccines that give protection 
against several childhood diseas­
es is scheduled from 2:00 until 
4:00 p.m. Thursday, March 24, in 
the Silverton Elementary School.

Protection is against polio, 
diphtheria, lock jaw (tetanus), 
whooping couch (pertussis), 
measles, rubella and mumps.
. The Texas Department of 
Health is charging money to help 
with the cost of keeping the clinic 
open. The amount of money 
charged will be based on family 
income and size, and the ability 
to pay.

Citizens Forum Is 
Planned Mon. Night

Attend Your 
Precinct Convention

Letters Need To Be Sent 
To Austin This Week

Judge Jimmy Ross was in 
Austin Wednesday, February 24, 
and met with Francisco Grajales, 
Program Specialist, at the De­
partment of Commerce, and the 
Judge says that all residents 
need to write letters this week to 
Mr. Grajales, setting forth your 
reasons why the grant is needed 
and why Briscoe County Proces­
sing, Inc. is so vital to the 
county’s economy.

Judge Ross said that he went 
through the grant application 
with Mr. Grajales, and all 
seemed to be in order. The 
scoring system was discussed, 
and the scores look good. If the 
scoring is high enough to qualify 
Briscoe County to receive the 
grant, a representative of the 
Department of Commerce, pro­
bably Mr. Grajales, will come 
here to look at the site, visit with 
the people, and see what we have 
going.

Then when Mr. Grajales re­
turns to Austin, he would verify 
the proposed project, and then it 
goes before the board for a 
hearing and recommendation.

Some letters have already 
reached the Department of Com­
merce, but it is vital that more be 
sent THIS week. Address your 
letters now to Mr. Francisco 
Grajales, Program Specialist, 
Community Development Finan­
cing Department, Texas Depart­
ment of Commerce, Box 12728, 
Capitol Station, Austin, Texas 
78711. --------

While in Austin, Judge Ross 
also visited Amanda Stover, 
Community Development, Tour­
ism Department, Department of 
Commerce, and explained what 
we are trying to do here, and 
later this year she plans to come 
here to meet with the people of 
the county. She is excited about 
the hunting and camping oppor­
tunities, Lake Mackenzie, Cap- 
rock Canyons State Park and the 
scenic beauty of the area.

Work on the museum and 
library is moving along, accord­
ing to Judge Ross. While in 
Austin, he also went by the 
Texas Historical Commission and

Make Plans Early 
For 1988
School Homecoming

The 1988 reunion of the 
Ex-Students of Silverton High 
School will be held Saturday, 
August 13, at the Silverton 
School Auditorium, which has 
recently been air-conditioned. 
Registration will begin at 9:00 
a.m. with the program beginning 
at 10:00 a.m. Speaker for this 
year’s program will be Robert 
Rhode, who is a graduate with 
the Class of 1962.

A local individual from each 
graduating class will be contact­
ed to send out letters to their 
classmates. These letters have 
been printed and should be 
mailed as soon as possible, so 
that the returning alumni can 
make their vacation plans.

If you would like to volunteer 
to send your class letters, please 
contact Joy Stodghill at 823-2028 
or LaRue Garvin at 823-2235.

visited Curtis Tunnell, who is 
interested in what is being done 
in this county. An architect is 
going to be in Silverton soon to 
evaluate the courthouse and 
make recommendations for its 
historical preservation.

Judge Ross is continuing to 
work on getting disaster relief 
for the farmers. Congressman 
Beau Boulter has been requested 
to send a letter to Secretary of 
Agriculture Richard Lyng, ur­
ging him to authorize the disas­
ter payments to farmers which 
are already provided for by law. 
The Judge has also been in touch 
with Senator Phil Gramm and 
Senator Lloyd Bentsen in regard 
to disaster payments, and to 
request that an appointment be 
set up with Secretary Lyng at 
which a group of area farmers 
could meet with him in Washing­
ton, D. C. to discuss the 
importance of the payments.

SILVERTON NAMES LISTED 
IN UNCLAIMED MONEY 
FUND BY STATE

Several Silverton names were 
listed by the State Treasurer as 
having cash in the Unclaimed 
Money Fund.

They are Russell C. Ashley, M. 
A. Graham, John McCune and 
Eldon O’Neal.

For further information about 
the money the state is holding, 
you can call 1-800-321-2274.

No Fire 
Call Monday

The chain of Monday fire calls 
was broken this week, when the 
day went by quietly with no 
emergency services being need­
ed.

Sunday morning the volunteer 
firemen were called to a CRP fire 
west of the G. W. Lee home on 
the Jewell Lyon farm.

Silverton’s ambulance trans­
ported a patient to the Amarillo 
Emergency Receiving Center 
shortly before noon Sunday.

Activities Association 
Has Regular Meeting

Briscoe County Activities As­
sociation held its regular month­
ly meeting at the County Show 
Barn February 25. It was voted 
to have a sandwich bar at the 
school cafeteria during lunchtime 
for the Homecoming crowd Sat­
urday, August 13.

April 23 will be the group’s 
Highway Cleanup Day. They 
plan to have a Garage Sale April 
1-2, so if you have items to 
donate please contact a member.

Hand Baird, rodeo chairman, 
reported on plans for the rodeo 
August 12-13.

Thirty-one members were pre­
sent.

Our word admiral comes from 
the Arabic phrase “Amir ‘a ali,n 
which means a man in high 
authority.
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DO GOOD-FEEL GOOD
Did you know that doing for 

others can make you healthier? 
Most of the recommendations for 
good health involve things we do 
for ourselves—control our 
weight, stop smoking, exercise, 
eat a balanced diet.

According to Allan Lucks on 
the morning news show “Today,” 
research now indicates that

NO MARGIN FOR ERROR

Be Sure
Trust the knowledge and 
skill of our competent 
pha rm ac ists  when in, 
doubt about your 
prescription.

We Can Mail Your 
Prescriptions to You!

^  995-3525 
CITY DRUG STORE
Hwy. 86 & Maxwell 

Tulia, Texas

those who do things for others 
can improve their health and 
even lengthen their life.

My mother is living proof of 
this philosophy. She celebrated 
her 80th birthday last week and 
is one of the healthiest people I 
know. She has also done for 
others her entire life and contin­
ues to do so.

Research has found that those 
alone have more health prob­
lems. If we get “out of ourselves” 
and help others, we become a 
part of a greater group. We feel 
we gain control of our circum­
stances.

Mr. Lucks felt that this new 
finding could be a help to 
volunteerism. We in Briscoe 
County are blessed with an 
abundance of great volunteers 
who give many hours to our 
emergency services, youth pro­
grams, clubs, organizations, 
schools and churches. We have 
those who visit shut-ins, send 
cards to the ill, and prepare food 
for the grieving. If you are not 
presently involved in doing for 
others, why not find a person or 
group that needs help and

If you need work done on 
your vehicle, just call 

995-3565
during the day, or call

822- 2039 (Joe)
or

823- 2498 (Dale)
after 7:00 p.m.

They will pick up your vehicle 
in the morning, drive it to Tulia, 
make the repairs needed, and 
return it to you in the evening. 

Remember, we’re just a 
phone call away!

GRABBE-SIMPSON 
Motors, Inc.

The Congregation of the
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Meeting at Rock Creek

Extends a Gracious Welcome to A ll 
To Attend Any and A ll of Our Services.

SUNDAY
Morning W o rsh ip ................................. 10:30 a.m.
Evening W orsh ip................................................ 6:00 p.m.

WEDNESDAY
Even ing .............................................................. 7:00 p.m.
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volunteer. See if you don’t “feel 
good when you do good!”

Game Night Held 
Here Saturday

Fifty-five attended the family 
game night sponsored by the 
Briscoe County Activities Asso­
ciation Saturday night. This 
event is held on the last Saturday 
night of each month at the 
County Show Barn.

Games of “42”, Skip-Bo, Dom­
inoes, Disney Trivial Pursuit, 
Pictionary and Bingo were enjoy­
ed. Refreshments were served 
by the sponsoring organization.

Champion “42” players were 
Tom Burson and Joy Stodghill.

Mrs. Hubert Hall of Memphis 
visited in the home of her 
brother-in-law and sister, Mr. 
and Mrs. Berton Hughes, from 
Sunday afternoon until Friday of 
last week.

GIRL SCOUT NEWS
On February 27, the Junior 

Girl Scout Troop #165 had a Girl 
Scout Cookie Booth at Nance’s 
Food Store. We, the Junior Girl 
Scouts, would like to thank each 
of you who ordered and bought 
Girl Scout Cookies. It is nice to 
know what great people we have-, 
here in Silverton to support Girl 
Scouting. Thanks a million.

The next meeting will be 
March 7. Mrs. Barbara Knowlton 
will show us weaving.

Christina Stephens, reporter

Some people once believed 
crocodiles could catch their 
victims by the shadow.
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Your News 
Is Important!

The news about what you and 
your family are doing is an 
important part of your local 
newspaper, but the publishers of 
the Briscoe County News don’t 
know about it unless you tell 
them.

Whenever you have news for 
your hometown paper, please call 
the News Office, 823-2333.

Susan B. Anthony was ar­
rested for casting a vote in 
the 1872 presidential elec­
tion. She was fined $100. But 
she never paid it.

As we come to the last 
few days before the e lec­
tion, I would like to ask 
you for your vote for 
C om m iss ione r of Pre­
c inct 3. I have tried to 
see each of you, person­
ally, but if I have m issed 
ed anyone, I am sorry 
and I hope you w ill con­
sider this as a so lic ita ­
tion for your vote.
Nearly every voter in Precinct 3 knows me, personally, 
knows what I believe in, and knows what I stand for. 
You may also be assured that if I am elected, I w ill do 
my very best to serve and represent you, the people of 
Briscoe County, as I carry out the duties and make the 
decis ions that I w ill be called on to make, during my 
term of office as Commissioner.
Again, I ask you for your vote on March 8th in the 
Democratic Primary.

L. B. Garvin, Jr.
Candidate for Commissioner 

Briscoe County Precinct 3
POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY L. B. GARVIN, JR.
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March 2, 1978 — Silverton’s 
Owls were never headed once 
they got their bearings in the 
Region 1-B Basketball Tourna­
ment at Texan Dome in Level- 
land last week, and as the Region 
1-B champions will play in the 
State Tournament in Austin in 
the Superdrum at 8:30 a.m. 
Thursday. Their opponent is 
Avinger, the defending Class B 
State Champion . . .  The Owls are 
coached this year by Lyndel 
Norwood, who has been here for 
three years and was named All 
South Plains Coach of the Year 
last year . . .  All of the Owls have 
been winners this year, from the 
eighth grade level where Duane 
Reynolds is the coach, to the 
junior varsity and varsity levels . 
. . Fish being stocked at Lake 
Mackenzie . . .  Rita Gayle Brown 
and Jimmy K. Hughes were 
united in marriage February 24 
at the Chapel of the West in Las 
Vegas, Nevada. . .  Darla Strange 
to marry Eddie Dean Wood . . .

February 29, 1968 — Bean 
Exchange gets four-party service 
. . . Riding Club to Shamrock 
March 16 . . .  Mrs. Lula Vaughan 
buried here Monday . . . Mrs. 
Paul Ledbetter has returned 
home after spending several 
days at the Medical Center in 
Plainview . . . George Long 
recently underwent surgery at 
Northwest Texas Hospital in 
Amarillo . . . Brad Wilson has 
article in “Golf Digest” . . . Mrs. 
J. T. Gilkeyson has been a 
patient in the Lockney Hospital 
for ten days but is home now . . . 
Dean Butcher, a former Silver- 
ton resident, has been in Neblett 
Hospital in Canyon recuperating 
with a broken leg . . . Lynn 
Frizzell chosen to be included in 
publication honoring outstanding 
student council presidents . . . 
Joe Bob Watson is member of top 
agronomy team at Texas Tech 
University . . . Mrs. Norman 
Strange, Diana and Bill spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. Max 
Garrison at Bryan . . .

February 27, 1958 — W. H. 
Tennison retires as rural mail 
carrier . . . Mrs. Bob Dickerson 
suffered a stroke at her home 
here late last week. . .  William S. 
Childress, 87, buried at Childress 
Sunday . . . Buck Baird was a 
patient in the Lockney Hospital 
from Wednesday through Friday 
of last week . . .  Mr. and Mrs. D. 
T. Northcutt and Mr. and Mrs. 
William Strange attended the 
Banker’s Convention in Fort 
Worth Friday and Saturday. 
They visited Mr. and Mrs. Perry 
Whittemore and W. P. at Baylor 
Hospital . . . Weekend guests in 
the home of Mrs. Annie Grabbe 
and Louis were Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Adkins and Steven, Mr. and 
Mrs. James Allison of Lubbock, 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Grabbe and Pat 
of Silverton, and Teddy Gale 
Hancock of Plainview . . . Mrs. 
Fred Lemons returned home 
Thursday after a three-week 
visit with her son and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Lemons, at Los 
Alamos, „New Mexico . . . Mrs. 
James Henderson and Freda and 
Mrs. Walter Brannon and Linda 
were in Tulia Saturday afternoon 
. . .  Mrs. Virgil Crow and Phyllis 
were in Plainview Friday, where 
they visited their aunt, Mrs. 
Elma Baker, and Mr. and Mrs.

Hugh Lovett . . . Mr. and Mrs. 
Vernon Garrison of Tulia called 
on Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Hodges 
Sunday afternoon . . .

February 26, 1948—Moisture 
total for February is 1.02 inches . 
. . Services held here for Mrs. 
Elmer Ayres . . . Death claimed 
Betty June Pointer, 15, in wreck 
here last week. Hospitalized with 
injuries were Mildred Foster and 
“Dillie” Pierce, also of Quitaque. 
The accident took place about a 
mile west of Silverton . . . Mrs. 
Gordon Montague and son, Ted­
dy Gail, Mrs. Will Smithee and 
Mrs. Kenneth Bain attended the 
birthday party of Keith Green at 
Turkey Wednesday . . . Mrs. 
Monroe Lowrey returned home 
from an Amarillo hospital Tues­

day, after undergoing surgery 
there last week . . .  Services held 
for Jim Bomar Tuesday . . . 
Gerald Smith, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J. T. Smith, has been in the 
hospital suffering with a cold . . . 
Polly Steele of Lubbock and Mr. 
and Mrs. Louie Kitchens and Joe 
were dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Wade Steele Sunday . . . 
Senior Girl Scouts entertain with 
backward party . . . Guinn 
Fitzgerald spent Friday night 
with Jamie Allison . . . Mr. and 
Mrs. E lbert Stephens were 
Plainview visitors Monday . . . 
Jerry and Carolyn Frizzell have 
been on the sick list this week . . .

March 3, 1938—Fight night 
well attended Tuesday. Boys 
turn pugilists to earn money for

sweaters . . . Charles Dunn and 
Raymond Hunt were paired off 
at 125 and 139 pounds respective­
ly. Charley ran out of wind and 
absorbed several stiff punches. 
In the same weight class W. L. 
Perry and Bruce Burleson tan­
gled with very little to say in 
favor of either. For plain slug­
ging and plenty of it the bout 
between Orlee Mills and Goose 
McGavock was top rate. The only 
knockout of the evening was 
scored when Guinn Williams, 97, 
knocked out Lewis Johnson, 180. 
There was something snaky 
about this bout. Most sportswrit- 
ers thought it was fixed before­
hand, as young Williamson jump­
ed on a chair and tossed the sleep 
producer. As middleweights, Da-

tis Martin and Len Lee battled 
away in a friendly fashion that 
makes one wonder what there is 
in friendship anyway. The first 
two rounds were probably Date’s 
and the last Len’s. Buster Allard, 
163, and Jimmy Blackwell, 155, 
tangled in a way that didn’t even 
look friendly. The final bout 
between Stud Chitty and Cran­
berry Allred almost deprived the 
Briscoe County News of a 
linotype operator . . . Mrs. 
Warner Reid is hostess to 1925 
Study Club . . . Don Alexander, 
who is employed on the JA 
Ranch, was home over the 
weekend. . .

Regular airmail service was first 
established in 1918.
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interest rates on savings accounts, and the fact 
that your money is insured by the government 
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when you bank with us, you’ll get the answers.

i i r  s i  ^ S t e t t e  J ^ a n h

FDIC



Miss Lynne Holcomb became 
the bride of Clayton Fowler in a 
formal double-ring ceremony at 
2:00 p.m. Saturday, February 27, 
1988. The First Presbyterian 
Church in Pampa was the scene 
of the candlelight ceremony.

Dr. John Judson performed 
the ceremony in front of a 
15-taper candelabrum flanked by 
seven-taper candletrees.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. James A. Holcomb 
of Pampa, and the bridegroom is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
Fowler of Silverton.

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a magnifi­
cent gown styled of white Matte 
taffeta, richly embroidered in 
silk floral designs. Her sweet­
heart neckline was edged with a 
row of the silk embroidery, and 
her fitted bodice had a basque 
waistline which was overlaid 
with piping. The back of the 
bodice was closed with covered 
buttons which extended below 
the waistline, and a large bow of 
the Matte taffeta was featured at 
the back waistline. Her fitted 
sleeves were also of the taffeta, 
and had silk embroidery with 
cut-out motifs on them. Her full 
skirt was of Matte taffeta and 
was richly embroidered with silk 
flowers. The upper tier of the 
skirt was scalloped and edged 
with embroidery, and the lower 
tier of the skirt featured a wide 
flounce of the taffeta. The back of 
the skirt had seven wide flounces 

„of taffeta which began at the 
wafstine' and' -flowed :m ta a full 
cathedral train.

She added a hat covered with 
white taffeta accented with se­
quin appliques, seed pearls and 
white roses on the sides of the 
crown with three layers of tulle 
drifting down her back, the first 
layer to shoulder length, the 
second to fingertip length and 
the third lay on the train of the 
gown.

She carried a cascade of pink 
roses and white stephanotis 
surrounding five white gladiola 
blossoms. To carry out tradition, 
she wore her great-great-grand- 
mother’s cameo pin for some­
thing old, her wedding ensemble 
as something new, and added a

blue garter.
Serving her sister as maid of 

honor was Miss Marcie Holcomb 
of Santa Monica, California. Mrs. 
Linda Holcomb of Lubbock, 
sister-in-law of the bride, was 
bridesmaid.

They wore dresses of royal 
blue embossed taffeta designed 
with long sleeves which ended in 
points at their wrists. Their 
fitted bodices with basque waist­
lines went into circular skirts 
which fell to tea-length. Each 
sleeve had seven covered but­
tons and the dress backs were 
closed with 24 buttons. They 
wore dyed-to-match shoes and 
carried cascades of white spider 
mums, pink roses and white 
stephanotis showered with royal 
blue ribbon.

Serving as best man was Eddie 
Medford of Haskell. Groomsman 
was Kevin Bruington of An­
drews. Guests were seated by 
Steve Holcomb of Lubbock, 
brother of the bride, and Jim 
Goldston of Crowell.

Doris Goad was organist and 
Stephanie Bowen of Dalhart was 
harpist, and they played the 
traditional wedding march and 
recessional. Eddie Burton, solo­
ist, presented “That’s What 
Friends Are For” and “We’ve 
Only Just Begun.”

The bride’s mother wore a 
wedgewood blue dress with 
matching jacket and added a 
corsage of pink roses and seed 
pearls. The groom’s mother was 
attired in a cream skirt, blouse 
and matching jacket and also 
wore a corsage of pink roses and 
seed pearls.

RECEPTION
A reception was held following 

the ceremony at the Coronado 
Inn in Pampa.

The bride’s table was covered 
with a white cloth accented with 
pink and white bows at the 
corners. The bouquets of the 
bride and her attendants provid­
ed decorative accents on the 
table. Refreshments were served 
by June Ellison and Debbie 
Hobgood.

The strawberry wedding cake 
was a three-tiered confection 
iced with white with roses and 
sweetpeas cascading down the 
sides of the tiers.

Julie Ellison was in charge of 
the guest book, and Elizabeth 
Lewis also assisted with the 
reception.

Anis Mace and Diamond Wil­
liams presided at the groom’s 
table where a German chocolate 
sheet cake in the shape of Texas 
was served. The cake was 
decorated with a miniature bride 
holding onto the groom’s coat­
tails.

After a wedding trip to Las 
Vegas, Nevada, the couple will 
be at home in Haskell, where the 
groom is a vice president and 
director of the First National 
Bank. A graduate of Silverton 
High School, he received his BBA 
degree in finance at Texas Tech 
University in December 1983.

The bride is a graduate of

Pampa High School and received 
her BFA degree in interior 
design in May 1985 at Texas 
Tech. She is a member of the 
American Society of Interior 
Designers and of the Texas 
Association of Interior Design­
ers.

REHEARSAL PARTY
The wedding party was enter­

tained at a dinner at the 
Coronado Inn the evening before 
the wedding. Parents of the 
couple hosted the dinner.

SILVERTON SCHOOL
LUNCHROOM MENU 

March 7-11
Monday — Fish and Tartar 

Sauce, French Fries, Cornbread, 
Fruit, Milk

Tuesday — Pot Pie, Salad, 
Cheesestraws, Cake, Milk

Wednesday — Burritoes, Sal­
ad, Beans, Cornbread, Fruit, 
Milk

Thursday — Steak and Gravy, 
Mashed Potatoes, Green Beans, 
Hot Rolls, Honey and Butter, 
Milk

Friday — Submarine Sand­
wiches, French Fries, Fruit and 
Jello, Milk

THURSDAY: SEARCH 3,1988

People once believed the best 
time to plant corn was by the 
light of the full moon.

Fll show you nine 
ways to save with 

Allstate car insurance.
We offer famous Allstate car insurance with 

nine reduced premium plans*. Check those ap­
plying to you:

□  Economy Car Discount
□  Make & Model Rate
□  Low Mileage Rate
□  Multi-Car Discount
□  55 & Retired Discount

□  Good Driver Rate
□  Farm Discount
□  Air Bag Discount
□  Car Pool Rate

Visit or call us soon, and w e’ll show you how 
much you could save. &

C g J t W * -
Joann
Carolyn
Sam
Boyd

AT
Sadler-Vaughn Agency

132 W. Broadway 
Tulia, Texas

1- 800- 346-5354

*Our special rates and discounts are available in most states 
Allstate Insurance Company, Northbrook, IL
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Holcomb-Fowler Vows Exchanged 
In Formal Church Ceremony

Mrs. Clayton Fowler

Traveling With 
Caprock Country

Mar. 4, 8-12—Fifth Street Pub, Plainview 
Mar. 5, 9-1—Fifth Street Pub, Plainview 
Mar. 12, 8-12—Rock Creek Country Club 
Mar. 18, 7:30-11:30—Hereford Country Club 
Mar. 19 —Private Dance, Silverton Show Barn 
Mar. 25, 8-12—Renegade Club, Borger 
Mar. 26, 9-1—Renegade Club, Borger

Join Caprock Country For a Real Good Time!

RE-ELECT 
Fairy McWilliams 

as
Tax Assessor-Collector 
Briscoe County, Texas

I will continue to serve the people 
in the future as I have in the past.

Remember to vote March 8 in the 
Democratic Primary.

Thank you for your support.

POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY FAIRY McWILLIAMS
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Mr. and Mrs. Bob Singletary of Ocala, Florida 
announce the engagement of their daughter, Kathleen 
Dawn, to Mr. Cal Mack Brannon, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Brannon of Silverton. The wedding vows will be 
exchanged June 11, 1988 at Paramount Terrace 
Church in Amarillo.

Study Club Meets 
In Rampley Home

Century of Progress Study 
Club helds its February Heart 
Fund Workshop in the home of 
Mrs. 0. C. Rampley last Wednes­
day from 1:00 until 5:30 p.m. 
Title of the day’s activities was 
“Wheeling Toward Community 
Service.” Six members answered 
the roll call, “Give your heart a 
break and . . . ”

The annual Workshop was 
directed by Faye Rampley, Bris­
coe County Heart Fund Chair­

man. Clubmembers addressed 
and stuffed envelopes for mailing 
Heart Fund literature for the 
American Heart Association.

The ladies enjoyed a break 
from their work when the 
hostess served black currant tea, 
glazed pecans, and an enticing 
Pavlova—an Australian dessert 
topped with whipped cream, 
fresh strawberries, passion fruit 
and kiwi.

Clubmembers participating in 
the project with the hostess were 
Polly Montague, Jackie Mercer, 
Junis Hutsell, Beverly Bowman 
and Geneva Griffin.

Century of Progress Study

C R P  G ra s s  S e e d  
Hall County Farm Supply

Memphis, Texas

•  Quality Seed
•  Local Origin
•  Mixed to fit your needs
•  Very Competitive Prices
•  Free Storage until you’re 

ready to plant

Check Our Prices Before You Buy! 

Phone (806) 259-2335

Robert Hodges Don Ferrei
Night Ph. 259-3344 Night Ph. 259-3358
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Silverton School 
Personalities 
Chosen Recently

Students of Silverton High 
School recently chose Clay 
Schott and Gina Myers as Mr. 
and Miss SHS.

Others chosen for special hon­
ors included:

Best Dressed Boy and Girl — 
Bradley Brunson and Julie Gra­
ham ,

Most Handsome Boy—Neal 
Edwards

Most Beautiful Girl—Keeley 
Burson

Most Popular Boy and Girl — 
Robbie Me Waters and Shannon 
Bingham

Wittiest Boy and Girl—Ricky 
Clardy and Venita Asebedo 

Friendliest Boy and Girl—Ja­
mie Frizzell and Alison Grimland 

Most Athletic Boy and Girl — 
Kendal Minyard and DeLyn 
Patton

Several students were tabbed 
for honors by the faculty.

These selections included:
Most Likely to Succeed—Ryan 

Smith and Juannah Woods 
Most Dependable—John Cav- 

itt and Julie Towe 
Good Citizenship—Jim Cogdell 

and Keeley Burson 
Elected to Who’s Who were 

John Cavitt and Julie Graham, 
freshmen; Jim Cogdell and Penni 
Fogerson, sophomores; Neal Ed­
wards and Tara Nance, juniors; 
Ryan Smith and Gina Myers, 
seniors.

Juannah Woods was chosen as 
Most Outstanding Student, and 
Gina Myers was selected for the 
Daughters of the American Rev­
olution Award.

In 1984, it became illegal for cab 
drivers in Greece to chat with 
their fares.

Club asks that you please re­
member to make your annual 
contribution to the Briscoe Coun­
ty Heart Fund this week and also 
to make memorial contributions 
throughout the year in memory 
of loved ones. Just mail your 
check to Mrs. 0. C. Rampley, Box 
597, Silverton, Texas 79257. 
Memorial'contributions will be 
acknowledged—you will be mail­
ed a receipt and the person you 
designate will receive notifica­
tion of your donation to the 
Heart Fund in memory of their 
loved one.

The American Heart Associa­
tion is striving to help each 
person, but generous contribu­
tions are vitally needed.

To The Voters of Briscoe County
Once again, I would like to take this opportunity to 

ask for your vote. If elected, I will do my very best to 
serve the people of Briscoe County. I feel confident 
that I am capable of doing a good job.

I have worked at various jobs the past 27 years. My 
experience is with a bank, finance company, wholesale 
lumber business and Kelly G irl Services. I also worked 
part-time in the Tax Assessor-Co llector office in 
Silverton during my high school years.

I have been active in Scouts, PTA, Kids, Inc., 
Silverton Booster C lub and Little Dribblers. I have 
served in an office of some capacity to all these 
organizations.

My objective is to operate the Tax Assessor- 
Co llecto r office effic iently with the least amount of 
expense to the taxpayer.

I have tried to contact everyone in the county, but 
due to bad weather and a short time in which to 
campaign, I’m sure I have m issed some of you and I 
apologize. Please vote on March 8th.

Waynelle Couch
Candidate for Tax Assessor-Collector 

Briscoe County, Texas
POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY WAYNELLE COUCH

TO THE VOTERS OF 
BRISCOE COUNTY PRECINCT 1

I have tried to contact everyone in Precinct 1 at least 
once, possib ly twice, during my campaign for election 
as your County Commissioner.
I s o lic it  your vote in the Dem ocratic Primary on 
Tuesday, March 8.
If elected, I w ill serve to the best of my ability.
Thank you for your support. . . v,., „

ALTON (TOBE) RIDDELL
* \ > % ./ i f  h'' v ¡*8 ^ .c -* , - , - > v % v ■■

Candidate for Commissioner 
Briscoe County Precinct 1

POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY ALTON (TOBE) RIDDELL

DID YOU KNOW , .  i

A VOTE FOR

JOHN T.~ PRECINCT 3
«.GOOD CHOICE

FOR COMMISSIONER

SUBJECT TO ACTION OF DEMOCRATIC PRIMARY

POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY JOHN T. FRANCIS
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STRIKE A BLOW FOR GOOD GOVERN]
Be Sure to Cast Your Ballot For the Candidates of Your Choice

SUPER TUESDAY
M arch 8 ,1 9 8 8

7:00 a.m . - 7:00 p.m.

A bsentee Voting C ontinues through Friday, March 4
All Briscoe County Dem ocratic and Republican Voting 

Precincts Will Be Open Tuesday

BE SURE TO EXERCISE YOUR FREEDOM
These Sampl<

(

Brow

P

Schooler 

G

Grab] 

Verb 

]

Jol

I

Sil 

B  

Bi

REPUBLICAN PARTY PRIMARY ELECTION
(ELECCION PRIMARIA DEL PARTIDO REPUBLICANO)

(CONDADO DE) BRISCOE COUNTY, TEXAS
MARCH 8,1988 (8 de marzo de 1988)

SAMPLE BALLOT
(BOLETA DE MUESTRA)

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:)
Vote for the candidate of your choice in each race by placing an “X” in the square 
beside the candidate’s name. (Vote por el candidato de su preferencia en cada carrera 
marcando con una “ X " el cuadro al lado del nomPre del candidato.)
“I am a Republican and understand that I am ineligible to vote or participate in 
another political party’s primary election or convention during this voting year.” (“ Yo 
soy Republicano y comprendo que no estoy elegible para votar o participar en la elección 
primaria o la convención de algún otro partido politico durante este ano electoral.")

Preference for Presidential Nominee
(Preferencia para un candidato nombrado para presidente)
You may vote for one presidential candidate whose name appears on the ballot by 
placing an “X” in the square beside the candidate’s name or you may vote as 
uncommitted by placing an “X” in the square beside “Uncommitted”. Make only one 
choice. (Usted puede votar por un candidato para presidente cuyo nombre aparece en la 
boleta por marcar con una "X ”  el cuadro al lado del nombre del candidato o usted puede 
votar como votante no comprometido por marcar con una “X” el cuadro al lado de las 
palabras no comprometido. Haga solamente una selección.)
□  JACK KEMP
□  GEORGE BUSH
□  ALEXANDER M. HAIG, JR.
□  PETE DU PONT
□  BOB DOLE
□  PAT ROBERTSON
□  UNCOMMITTED (NO COMPROMETIDO)

UNITED STATES SENATOR
(Senador de los Estados Unidos)
□  WES GILBREATH
□  NED SNEAD
□  BEAU BOULTER
□  MILTON E. FOX

UNITED STATES REPRESENTATIVE, DISTRICT 13
(Representante de los Estados Unidos, Distrito Num. 13)
□  ALAN PICKERING
□  RON BUFFUM
□  CHIP STANISWALIS
□  LARRYS. MILNER
□  BOB PRICE
□  JIM BRANDON

RAILROAD COMMISSIONER
(Comisionado de Ferrocarriles)
□  P.S. (SAM) ERVIN
□  DALE W. STEFFES
□  RALPH E. HOELSCHER
□  ED EMMETT
RAILROAD COMMISSIONER, UNEXPIRED TERM
(Comisionado de Ferrocarriles, Termino No Completado)
□  KENTR. HANCE
CHIEF JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, UNEXPIRED TERM
(Juez Presidente, Corte Suprema, Termino No Completado)
□  TOM PHILLIPS
JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, PLACE 1
(Juez, Corte Suprema, Lugar Num. 1)
□  PAUL MURPHY
□  GEORGE BARBARY
JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, PLACE 2
(Juez, Corte Suprema, Lugar Num. 2)
□  NATHAN HECHT
□  D. CAMILLE DUNN
□  RONALDS. BLOCK
JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, PLACE 3
(Juez, Corte Suprema, Lugar Num. 3)
□  CHARLES BEN HOWELL
JUSTICE, SUPREME COURT, PLACE 4, UNEXPIRED TERM
(Juez, Corte Suprema, Lugar Num. 4, Termino no Completado)
□  BARBARA CULVER
PRESIDING JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS
(Juez Presidente, Corte de Apelaciones Criminales)
□  DAVID A. BERCHELMANN, JR.
JUDGE, COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS, PLACE 2
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar Num. 2)
□  TOM RICKHOFF
MEMBER, STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION, DISTRICT 15
(Miembro de la Junta Estatal de Instrucción Publica, Distrito Num. 15)
□  MONTE HASIE
STATE SENATOR, DISTRICT 31
(Senador Estatal, Distrito Num. 31)
□  TEEL BIVINS
□  RONSLOVER
STATE REPRESENTATIVE, DISTRICT 84
(Representante Estatal, Distrito Num. 84)
□  GARY IVEY
□  TOM CHRISTIAN 
COUNTY CHAIRMAN
(Presidente del Condado)
□ _____________________________

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:)
Place an “X” in the square beside the statement indicating the way you wish to vote.
(Marque con una “ X”  el cuadro al lado de la frase que Indica la manera en que quiere usted 
votar.)

□ FOR (A FAVOR DE)

□  AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE) }
“English should be established as the Official Language of 

the State of Texas and the United States of America.”
“ El ingles debe ser establecido como el idioma oficial del estado 
de Texas y de los Estados Unidos de America."

«A í
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VIENT

OF CHOICE!
} Ballots Presented as a Courtesy of these 

Local Businesses

Brown Hardware 

, ]aprock Food Store 

Jerry’s Malt Shop 

n-McMurtry Implement 

Leming Well Service 

-Gordon Funeral Directors 

larvin Oil Company 

Hutsell Jewelry 

:>e-Simpson Motors, Inc. 

n B. Towe Agency, Inc. 

Briscoe Implement 

First State Bank 

inson’s Gin Company 

dance’s Food Store 

verton Oil Company 

riscoe Cooperatives 

riscoe County News

DEMOCRATIC PARTY PRIMARY ELECTION
(ELECCION PRIMARIA DEL PARTIDO DEMOCRATICO)

(CONDADO DE) BRISCOE COUNTY, TEXAS 

MARCH 8, 1988 (8 de marzo de 1988)

SAMPLE BALLOT
(BOLETA DE MUESTRA)

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:)
Vote for the candidate of your choice in each race by placing an "X" in the square beside the candidate's name. (Vote por el candidato de su preferencia 
en cada carrera marcando con una "X" el cuadro al lado del nombre del candidato.)
"I am a Democrat and understand that I am ineligible to vote or participate in another political party's primary election or convention during this voting 
year." ("Yo soy Demócrata y  comprendo que no estoy elegible para votar o participar en la elección primaria o la convención de algún otro partido politico 
durante este año electoral.")

Preference for Presidential Nominee
(Preferencia para un candidato nombrado para presidente)
You may vote for one presidential candidate whose name appears 
on the ballot by placing an "X" in the square beside the candidate's 
name. (Usted puede votar por un candidato para presidente cuyo 
nombre aparece en la boleta por marcar con una "X" el cuadro al 
lado del nombre del candidato.)

□  BRUCE BABBITT
□  DAVID E. DUKE
□  LYNDON H. LaROUCHE, JR.
□  W. A. WILLIAMS
□  GARY HART
□  PAUL SIMON
□  NORBERTG. DENNERLL JR
□  AL GORE
□  JESSE L. JACKSON
□  DICK GEPHARDT
□  MICHAELS DUKAKIS

State Representativo, District 84
(Representante Estatal, Distrito Núm. 84)

□  J. J. BARLOW, JR.
□  WARREN CHISUM

Justice, 7th Court of Appeals District, Place 1
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones, Distrito Núm. 7, Lugar Núm. 1)

□  RICHARD N. COUNTISS

Justice, 7th Court cf Appeals District, Place 2
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones, Distrito Núm. 7, Lugar Núm. 2)

□  JOHN T. BOYD

County Judge, Unexpired Term
(Juez del Condado, Término no Completado)

□  JIMMY M. ROSS

United States Senator
(Senador de los Estados Unidos)

□  LLOYD BENTSEN
□  JOE SULLIVAN

United States Representative, District 13
(Representante de los Estados Unidos, Distrito Núm. 13)

□  RANDY HOLLUMS
□  BILLSARPALIUS
□  ED LEHMAN

Railroad Commissioner
(Comisionado de Ferrocarriles)

□  JAMESE. (JIM) NUGENT
□  JERRY J. LANGDON
□  JOHN THOMAS HENDERSON

Railroad Commissioner, Unexpired Term
;Comisionado de Ferrocarriles, Término no Completado)

□  CLINT HACKNEY

Chief Justice, Supreme Court, Unexpired Term
(Juez Presidente, Corte Suprema, Término no Completado)

□  JOHN E. HUMPHREYS
□  TED Z ROBERTSON

5fCV

Sheriff
(Sherife) *

□  RICHARD (DICK) ROEHR

County Tax Assessor-Collector
(Asesor-Colector de Impuestos del Condado)

□  WAYNELLE COUCH
□  f a ir y  l McW il l ia m s

□  GLORIA WOOD

County Surveyor, l/nexpired Term
(Agrimensor del Condado, Término no Completado)

□  BEVERLY A. BOWMAN

County Commissioner, Precinct No. 1
(Comisionado del Condado. Precinto Núm. 1)

□  ALTON RIDDELL
□  EDDIE RHODERICK !»«?£■? *i lO I
□  AARON E. YOUNGER

County Commissioner, Precinct No. 3
(Comisionado del Condado, Precinto Núm. 3)

□  JOHN T. FRANCIS
□  L. B. GARVIN JR.i—i '
□  LARRY COMER

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 1
(Juez, Code Suprema, Lugar Nùm. 1)

□  LLOYD DOGGETT
□  MARSHA ANTHONY

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 2
(Juez, Code Suprema, Lugar Nùm. 2)

□  CAROL R. HABERMAN
□  BILL KILGARLIN

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 3
(Juez, Code Suprema, Lugar Nùm. 3)

□  ART VEGA
□  RAUL A. GONZALEZ

County Chairman
(Presidente del Condado)

□ _________

Precinct Chairman, Precinct No. 1
(Presidente del Precinto, Precinto Núm. 1)

□ ____

Precinct Chairman, Precinct No. 3
(Presidente del Precinto, Precinto Núm. 3)

□ _________________

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 4, Unexpired Term
(Juez, Code Suprema, Lugar Núm. 4, Término no Completado)

□  JACK HIGHTOWER

Presiding Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals
(Juez Presidente, Code de Apelaciones Criminales)

□  MIKE McCORMICK
□  RON CHAPMAN

Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 1
(Juez, Code de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar Núm. 1)

□  CHARLES F. (CHUCK) CAMPBELL

Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 2
(Juez, Code de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar Núm. 2)

□  CHUCK MILLER

Member, State Board of Education, District 15
(Miembro de la Junta Estatal de Instrucción Pública, Distrito Núm. 15)

□  PAULC. DUNN

State Senator, District 31
(Senador Estatal, Distrito Núm 31)

□  NANCY GARMS
□  H. BRYAN POFF, JR
□  MEL PHILLIPS

. ' 1 - o ; ; ;• *.
Instruction Note: (Nota de Instrucción:)

Place an “X" in the square beside the statement indicating the way 
you wish to vote (Marque con una "X" el cuadro al lado de la frase 
que indica la manera en que quiere usted votar)

Referendum Proposition
(Referendum Proposición)

TEXANS SHALL MAINTAIN 
THEIR RIGHT TO SELECT 
JUDGES BY A DIRECT VOTE 
OF THE PEOPLE RATHER 
THAN CHANGE TO AN AP­
POINTMENT PROCESS 
CREATED BY THE LEGISLA­
TURE. (Los Texanos deberán 
de conservar su derecho de 
seleccionar juesce por el voto 
directo de la gente en lugar de 
cambiar a un proceso que la 
legislatura establezca en el cual 
los jueces se seleccionan por 
nombramiento.)

□  FOR (POR)

□  AGAINST (CONTRA)

1* *
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THE STRENGTH OF A COMMUNITY LIES IN THE 
INVOLVEMENT OF ITS YOUNG PEOPLE

IXI Vote For
EDDIE RHODERICK
Candidate For Commissioner

Briscoe County Precinct 1 
in the Democratic Primary March 8,1988

Your Vote and Influence Appreciated!
POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY EDDIE RHODERICK

Mize Pharmacy 
& T V

Call 652-2435 
in Lockney

Day or Night 
A lm ost always 

available 
RCA T V s  at 

Discount Prices
37-tfc

At times during the orbital motion of Uranus, the north or south pole is aligned 
nearly face on toward the Sun. During those times, the poleward hemisphere receives 
nearly constant sunlight, while the other hemisphere languishes in decades-long dark­
ness.

VOTE
March 8th

Democratic Primary
Ed Lehman
U.S. Congress

Ed Lehman and Family

• Ed Lehman is the conservative who upholds traditional family values.
• Ed Lehman wants to bring jobs back to Texas with tougher foreign trade policies.
• Ed Lehman wants to restore trust in Congress.

EXPERIENCED, MATURE LEADERSHIP 
FOR THE 13TH CONGRESSIONAL DISTRICT

Bryan Gamer and sons, Matthew and Nicholas, of 
Longview display trophies and cars from the Pine 
Wood Derby.

Ants can be frozen for long 
periods without harm. Many 
spend the w in ter inside 
logs and stumps, coated 
w ith  ice crystals.

Garner Boys Do 
Well In Pine 
Wood Derby

Nicholas Garner of Longview 
recently won the trophy for 
fastest car out of the 80 entries in 
Pack 211’s Pine Wood Derby. 
Cub Scouts had to place first or 
second in their age division to 
qualify for the final race.

Nick won first place in the 
third grade division, while his 
brother, Matthew, won second 
place in the fifth grade division.

Nick has just earned the rank 
of Bear, and Matt is a Webelo

working on his Arrow of Light.
They are the children of Bryan 

and Mary Garner of Longview, 
the grandchildren of Clifton and 
Joy Stodghill and the great­
grandchildren of Bern and Bon­
nie May of Silverton.

The word rabies comes 
from the Latin and means 
rage or fury.
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Almost 300 letters from farm 
groups, political entities, busi­
nesses and individuals have gone 
to Washington in pursuit of help 
for High Plains farmers whose 
1987 crops were destroyed by 
weather.

The letters, along with a letter 
of request signed by High Plains 
congressmen and Texas sena­
tors, were hand delivered to U. 
S. Department of Agriculture 
Secretary Richard Lyng on Feb­
ruary 25. They were generated 
and forwarded to Washington by 
Lubbock-based Plains Cotton 
Growers, Inc., as part of an 
emergency disaster aid effort 
that began after widespread hail­
storms last July.

Every county on the Plains 
suffered losses to some degree, 
according to PCG Executive Vice 
President Donald Johnson, but 
the most concentrated damage 
fell on Briscoe, Floyd, Crosby, 
Dawson, Lamb, Lynn and Bailey 
counties.

Those seven counties, accord­
ing to a study of damage that 
occurred through August 14 by 
Dr. Jackie Smith, Area Exten­
sion Agronomist, tallied total 
losses of over 150,000 acres of 
cotton and severe losses on 
another 92,000 acres. Net dollar 
losses, he estimates, were a 
minimum of $35 million at the

farm level. Not included in Dr. 
Smith’s calculations are losses of 
corn, wheat and other crops, 
losses in other counties or the 
effects of hailstorms occurring in 
late August and September.

The Food Security Act of 1985. 
gives the Secretary authority to 
make special disaster payments 
to producers who sustain losses 
that create an economic emer­
gency of such magnitude as to 
preclude its alleviation by other 
existing forms of Federal assis­
tance.

With 300 first-hand testimon­
ials, documentation of the facts 
and follow-up actions by PCG, 
the National Cotton Council and 
others, Johnson says, “We hope 
to remove any doubt that may 
remain in the Secretary’s mind 
that hundreds of our producers 
qualify for disaster payments as 
authorized by law.”

The only concession made by 
USD A so far has been to declare 
Floyd County a disaster area in 
which producers are eligible for 
low interest emergency disaster 
loans. And that declaration also 
qualifies producers in contiguous 
counties, including Motley, Dick­
ens, Crosby, Lubbock, Hale, 
Swisher and Briscoe.

Such loans will be helpful to 
some, Johnson admits. But piling 
another loan on top of already

intolerable debt loads will not 
solve the problem, he adds.

Gravesites Of Former 
Prisoners Of Wars 
Now Being Located

The Texas Panhandle Chapter 
of the American Ex-Prisoners of 
War Inc., is trying to locate the 
gravesites of all former prisoners 
from all wars.

The chapter is asking anyone 
knowing the locations of those 
graves in this area as well as any 
other information about any of 
the former prisoners of war 
please to send the information to 
Edward Seymour, Chapter Com­
mander, 3726 Fountain Terrace, 
Amarillo, Texas 79106, or to 
Special Projects Officer James 
M. Bloxom, P. 0. Box 636, 
Frankston, Texas 75763.

The P. 0. W. name, gravesite

BRISCOE COUNTY NEWS

and any other personal informa­
tion will be made a part of a 
permanent record and kept in 
the Prisoner of War Museum at 
Andersonville, Georgia. This mu­
seum is maintained by the 
United States Department of 
Interior.

Six Flags Over 
Texas To Begin 
1988 Season

Six Flags Over Texas will 
begin its 28th season Saturday, 
March 5.

Last year the Arlington theme 
park welcomed more than 2.7 
million visitors from around the 
world. Since its opening in 1961, 
more than 56 million persons 
have been entertained, making 
Six Flags the state’s largest 
single tourist attraction.

Major additions are being 
made to Six Flags for the ’88

season. The Silver Star Carousel, 
a 1925 creation of master carou­
sel builder William Dentzel, has 
undergone a three-year restora­
tion and will be opened to park 
visitors in mid-March.

Early visitors will also see 
work underway on a new food 
court, the largest addition ever 
to Six Flags food service facili­
ties. It is located in the park’s 
U.S.A. section.

Six Flags will be open on 
weekends only until May 28, 
when daily operation for the 
summer begins. The park will 
open daily for Spring Break from 
March 19 through March 27. 
Gates will open at 10:00 a.m. 
each operating day. Closing 
hours vary.

One-day tickets are $17.95. 
Tickets for two consecutive days 
are $22.95. The price for children 
under 48 inches tall and senior 
citizens age 55 and over is $11.95. 
All prices are plus tax.

PAGE NINE

To The Voters of Briscoe County j
When I moved back to this County in 1975, it was the 
only home I knew, and I needed the help of my parents 
and friends. Now I need your help again. I need your 
votes to win this election.
I want everyone of you to know that I have been out 
working and trying to see each and every one of you, 
but due to the bad weather and roads, plus such a short 
time I am sure I have m issed some of you. So please 
understand that I have tried to reach each and every 
one that I could, and hope the ones I m issed do 
understand.
I promise I w ill run this office for the good of the 
people. I w ill do my best to work with the people after 
office hours, if necessary. If elected, I w ill devote full 
time to the job and I w ill run the office by myself. By 
doing this, B riscoe County w ill save a considerable 
amount of money in salaries.’
There is no doubt in my mind about running the office, 
because of the previous secretarial experiences I have 
had. I have been working in o ffices for 18 years doing 
bookkeep ing -a ccoun tin g , typ ing  and genera l 
secretarial work.
Each job consisted of greeting the general public. I like 
to be with people. I like to greet and work with the 
public.
If I am elected, I promise I w ill run the office for the 
good of everyone.
Be sure and go vote on Super Tuesday, March 8th.

Thank You For Your Support!

GLORIA (Wallace) WOOD
DEMOCRATIC CANDIDATE FOR

TAX ASSESSOR - COLLECTOR 
Briscoe County, Texas

POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY GLORIA WOOD

LARRY COMER
For Precinct 3 Commissioner

A MAN OF BROAD-BASED BUSINESS EXPERIENCE

Larry worked his way through school and earned a degree in Agriculture 
from Texas Tech. He then became one of the youngest oil drilling 
superintendents Parker Drilling Company ever had in South America. He also 
managed his own drilling partnership in Oklahoma but decided~tcTfarm and 
rear his family at Silverton. He is still farming, running cattle, and recently 
diversified into vegetable growing and marketing. He was a charter member 
and the first president of the Plainview Farmer’s Market Association.

A MAN OF CAUTIOUS OPTIMISM

Larry is happy to see our county take advantage of recent blessings of 
prosperity but he would also like to see us capitalize on those individuals and 
organizations already making efforts to identify existing assets and develop 
internal resources and productive capacity. He says, “These efforts can be 
tremendously beneficial without spending a lot of inside or outside money.”

A MAN OF SOUND POLITICS

Larry has always been a loyal Democrat since he was old enough to vote 
and was once a Briscoe County delegate to the Democratic State Convention.

A MAN WHO REALLY CARES ABOUT PEOPLE

Larry is an Emergency Medical Technician and gives his time to the 
Volunteer Fire Department and the Silverton Ambulance Service. Summers 
he coaches young people’s baseball. Larry believes public office requires a true 
spirit of servitude.

i t f  Vote Larry Comer March 8
in the Democratic Primary

POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY LARRY COMER

#  Í
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*2.50 
*1.60

TAYLOR’S CROP CLINIC

Half Pound 2-4D................

Our Plane, Your Chem ical.

PER ACRE 

PER ACRE

SPRAYING SERVICE 
Phone 995-4713

Paymaster Ginning Services
Quality Ginning at Quality Prices

We Gin to Gin Again—Let Us Gin For You!
Wear Cotton—Made and Grown in the U.S.A.

Silverton Ja ck ie -R on  Quitaque

r 455-1440
455-1129

823-2178 Jack - Charles

<

CRP SEED
■  order now to guarantee supply
■  quality native grass seeds

■  custom blending

■  technical assistance

■  immediate availability

Call or come by

GRASS SEED
Tel. 1-800-872-0522 

413 S. Avenue D Abernathy, TX

H & H FERTILIZER
The Services and Products we have include: i

SOIL TESTING |
At our cost (if we fertilize your field). We still dig your | 
samples and send to A&L Testing Lab, Lubbock, Texas. ¡ 
Cop ies of soil test furnished to each customer. §

CHEMICALS I
We have bulk Treflan, all Herbicides and Insecticides. ¡ 
We custom spray from Ground and Airplane, and apply ¡ 
Chem icals with Liquid Fertilizers. §

ANHYDROUS AMMONIA I
We have rigs for your Tractors, dual purpose Rigs for ¡ 
Anhydrous and Liquid Fertilizer. We will custom apply. = 

DRY FERTILIZERS f
Combination of blends and pull spreader rigs for your ¡ 
tractor or we can apply. 1

LIQUID FERTILIZERS ¡
We build blends to fit so il test. We can apply with our ¡ 
Terrigator. Applied with Herbicides or Insecticides. ¡ 
Tractor ban Figs in beds or sidedress. Fertigation in | 
irrigation with our pumps. Combination liquid with = 
Anhydrous in deep ban placement (custom applied or | 
with your tractor). I

DAVID HOLT ¡
806-847-2221 |

i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i m i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i i m m i i i i m i i m i i i i i i m i i i i i i m i i i i i i m i i i i i i i i i m i i i i m m i i i i i i m i i i i i r

Owls Lose Bi-District 
Game To Nazareth

It took an extra fifty minutes 
for the game to get underway, 
but it took less time for it to be 
over.

After Silverton and Nazareth 
finally hooked up at 8:20 p.m. 
Tuesday at Hutcherson Center in 
Plainview in a Class 1-A bi-dis- 
trict shootout originally schedul­
ed for 7:30, the Swifts wasted 
little time in gunning down the 
Owls en route to a 67-34 victory.

The delay in the tipoff was a 
result of tardiness by Amarillo 
game officials who ended up 
totally absent. Plainview officials 
were called in to do the job.

The Owls stayed close the first 
6V2 minutes of the first quarter, 
before the Swifts broke loose and 
never looked back, taking a 22-10 
opening-period advantage.

“Nazareth is a very, very good 
ball club,” said Coach Kevin

P.O Box 17264, San Antonio, TX 78217

Cleveland whose Owls ended up 
with a 15-8 record for the year. 
“You have got to beat Nazareth 
because they are not going to 
beat themselves. They are so 
fundamentally sound.”

The Owls could do little to slow 
the Naz onslaught led by Chris 
Schmucker’s game-high 20 
points. The senior guard canned 
four field goals and four three- 
pointers in the game.

Senior guard Greg Gerber 
scored seven points for Naz in 
the second period, enough to 
outscore the entire Owl squad 
which ended up with six points. 
Naz, which improved to 22-5, 
scored 16 in the period to take a 
commanding 38-16 lead at half­
time.

Silverton managed just four 
points in the third quarter, all 
from leading scorer Rick Clardy 
who ended up with 15 for the 
night.

Nazareth, meanwhile got sev­
en points from Schmucker in the 
third while Brian Schmucker 
added one bucket. Kyle Schilling 
hit a pair of shots and Wade 
Hoelting accounted for five 
points, including a three-point 
bomb. Naz scored 20 points in the 
quarter and led 58-20 going into 
the final period.

Despite losing big to the 
disciplined Swifts, Coach Cleve­
land said he was proud of his

squad and what it had accom­
plished this season in making the 
playoffs.

“Overall, the guys changed 
some things at Silverton,” he 
noted. “They worked hard and 
had a great attitude. They went 
through some rough times and 
some adversity, but they stuck 
with it and I’m proud of them.”

In addition to Clardy, Kendal 
Minyard scored six points for the 
Owls while Neal Edwards and 
Ryan Smith added five and four 
points respectively. Jamie Friz­
zell and Jon Pigg each added a 
pair of points.

POLITICAL
ANNOUNCEMENTS

Subject to the action of the 
Republican Primary

FOR STATE REPRESENTA­
TIVE, 84th DISTRICT OF TEX- 
as:

TOM CHRISTIAN 
Armstrong County 

GARYT. IVEY 
Crosby County

POLITICAL
ANNOUNCEMENTS

Subject to Action of the 
Democratic Primary 

FOR CONGRESS, 13th DIS­
TRICT OF TEXAS:

JOHN R. [Randy] HOLLUMS 
Floyd County 

*
FOR STATE SENATOR, 31st 
DISTRICT OF TEXAS:

NANCY SAMPLE GARMS
Potter County 

*
FOR STATE REPRESENTA­
TIVE, 84th DISTRICT OF TEX­
AS:

WARREN CHISUM
Gray County 

*
FOR JUDGE, BRISCOE COUN­
TY, TEXAS:

JIMMY ROSS
*

FOR COMMISSIONER, BRIS­
COE COUNTY PRECINCT 1: 

ALTON [Tobe] RIDDELL 
EDDIE RHODERICK
AARON YOUNGER 

*
FOR COMMISSIONER, BRIS­
COE COUNTY PRECINCT 3: 

JOHN T. FRANCIS 
LARRY COMER

L. B. GARVIN, JR.
*

FOR SHERIFF, BRISCOE 
COUNTY, TEXAS:

RICHARD C. [Dick] ROEHR 
Re-election

xi
FOR TAX ASSESSOR-COL­
LECTOR, BRISCOE COUNTY, 
TEXAS:

f a ir y  McWil l ia m s
Re-election

WAYNELLE COUCH 
GLORIAWOOD_

Let’s Elect
ONE OF OUR OWN

Gary 
fi Ivey

State Representative 

for District 84
Pol. Ad. paid for by the Elect GARY IVEY for State 

Representative District 84 Committee; 
Edwin Moore, treasurer/Box 479, Ralls, TX 79357

New 4-Wheel Computerized

Alignment Machine
Call For Appointment Today!

Silverton Oil Company
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The original St. Nicholas was a 4th century Turkish 
bishop. According to legend, he dropped a bag of gold 
coins down a chimney into a stocking a poor girt had 
hung up by the fireplace to  dry.

Meet The 
Teachers

Ç \ G R / i

RR 1, Box 160
Woodward, Oklahoma 73801 

(405) 698-2235
Contemporary Conditioners & Brokers of Old World 

Blucstcm, Legumes & Native Grasses

a <lovl n\  
% '1 n'

i r t t t i  ^h h i«r|  in W.|Kr*i H f !•»

Can we give our children quality education 
econom ically?

Warren Chisum  thinks we can.

Vote
Democratic Primary 

March 8
Candidate For 84th District 

Texas House of Representatives
Warren

Chisum
T h e ♦ C h i s u m * T  r a i l

Pd. Pol. Adv. by Chisum Committee, E. L. (Smiley) Henderson, Treasurer, 
Box 2061, Pampa, Texas 79066.

The superintendent of Silver- 
ton Schools is David Cavitt. This 
is his first year to be a 
superintendent. He has 21 years 
experience in the field of educa­
tion, including 12 years as a 
principal. Prior to his career in 
education, he was a Church of 
Christ minister.

He was graduated from Mid­
land High School and has a B.S. 
degree from West Texas State 
University. He also has a M.S. 
degree from East Texas State 
University.

Mr. Cavitt is in charge of 
the general operations of the 
school district. It is his responsib­
ility to see that the school is run 
in accordance with state and 
federal laws. He works in cooper­
ation with the school board to 
establish policies for the school.

He is the public relations link 
between the school and the 
community. He is continuing to 
establish an open line of commun­
ication between the school and 
community to build toward a 
positive and productive educa­
tional atmosphere.

Mr. Cavitt’s wife, Martha, was 
a farm girl from Seminole, Texas. 
They have four children: Jerry is 
a student at South Plains Col­
lege; Laura is a student at 
Lubbock Christian University, 
and John and Steven attend
Silverton Schools.

*
This is Stanley Fogerson’s first 

year as principal of the Silverton 
Schools. He has five years 
experience in education. He 
holds a B.S. degree from Tarle- 
ton State University and a M.S. 
degree from Texas Tech Univer­
sity. He is currently working 
toward Administrative Certifica­
tion at West Texas State Univer­
sity.

Mr. Fogerson’s duties include 
teacher appraisals and sponsor­
ship of the Student Council. He is 
in charge of instruction, curricul­
um and discipline for kindergar­
ten through the twelfth grade. 
The school is offering more 
variety this school year. There 
have also been some changes in 
the curriculum schedule. An 
example of this change is moving 
the K-3 physical education clas­
ses to afternoon to make use of 
optimum learning hours in the 
morning.

D. Hall (detention hall) and 
I.S.S. (in-school suspension) are 
discipline tools that have been 
implemented.

Mr. Fogerson feels that the 
school has an excellent faculty 
and staff, and that school spirit is 
good.

His wife is Lynda. She is 
Briscoe County Extension

TO THE VOTERS IN PRECINCT 1
I am asking for your vote and support to help elect me as your Commissioner. I feel that I 
have the education and experience to serve in this capacity. I am willing to work hard and 
spend the necessary time to attend the duties of the office..
My goal is to represent you and have a progressive county.

AARON YOUNGER
Candidate for Commissioner

Briscoe County Precinct 1
POLITICAL ADVERTISING PAID FOR BY AARON YOUNGER

Agent. They have two daugh­
ters: Kristi, who is a student at 
Texas A&M University, and 
Penni, who is a student in 
Silverton High School.

HAPPY BIRTHDAY TO. . .
March 3—Rena Castillo, Con­

nie Simpson, Mary Grantham 
March 4—Zane Reagan 
March 5—Carl Minyard, Matt 

McGinn

March 6—Mary John Harris, 
Nannie Bomar 

March 8—Kerry Baird 
March 9—Jace Francis

HAPPY ANNIVERSARY TO. . .
March 5—Mr. and Mrs. Thom­

as Lee Perkins, sr.

People once believed fruit from 
the cypress tree would tighten 
loose teeth.

ELECT
TOM

CHRISTIAN

FOR STATE 
REPRESENTATIVE

84th District—  
Republican

You are encouraged to Vote for 
Tom Christian for State Repre­
sentative from the 84th District. 
His past legislative experience 
and strong voting record plus his 
local involvement make him an 
outstanding candidate for the 
job.

Paid Political Advertisement Paid for by 
Christian for State Representative, Nell 
Baily Treasurer, P.O. Box 1617, Pampa,
Texas 79065.
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PLAY IT SMART... GET INTO

For Sale
FENCE PANELS AND BALE 
Feeders For Sale at Brown-Mc- 
Murtry Implement. 45-tfc

ALL TYPES OF CATTLE feed 
and salt for sale. Bryan, 847-2654 
or 823-2106. 53-tfc
WATKINS PRODUCTS FOR 
Sale in Silverton. Briscoe County 
News, 508 South Main Street, or 
call 823-2333. 41-tfnc
FOR YOUR ELECTRIC FEN- 
cing needs, see Brown-McMur- 
try. We have battery, hi line or 
solar powered fencers. We also 
carry insulators, gate handles 
and wire. 46-tfc
FOR BIRTHDAY CAKES, Cake 
Donuts and Cookies for special 
occasions, call Lee at 847-2624.

13-tfc
SQUARE ALFALFA HAY Bales 
For Sale. New cutting, in the 
barn. Call 823-2213 between 8:30 
a.m. and 3:30 p.m. or after 6:30 
p.m. 43-tfc

KIRBY VACUUM CLEANERS 
Sales and Service, Bags and 
Belts. John Bowman, 808 Main.

49-tfc

WE NOW HAVE ELECTRIC 
Fence Posts for only 65c each. 
T-posts also in stock. Brown-Mc- 
Murtry Implement. 49-tfc

I RENTALS  j
Video Home Movies 

and Players I
VCR  and Beta

• Overnight or Weekends i. 
J3ROWIN^HARDWA R£  J

LOCKNEY MEAT CO.
Kill Days Monday 

through Friday 
CUSTOM PROCESSING 

Half and Quarter Cut,
Wrapped, Frozen and Fully 

Guaranteed 
SAM & KELLY 

FORTENBERRY 
652-3305

Corner of U. S. 70 and 
Farm Road 378 South

11-tfc

Hutsell Jewelry
Go ahead—Make my day! Come 
in and check out new arrivals: 
’"Large selection of I.D. Brace­
lets *New additions to Antique 
and Estate Collection: Rings, 
bracelets, rhinestone necklaces 
and earrings *New items in the 
Fine Jewelry, Silver and Fashion 
Jewelry Line. Tues.-Sat., 10 
a.m.-5:30 p.m. 823-2277 or 823- 
2087. 9-tfnc
TREES: GUARANTEED 100% 
Pecan Trees, 7-8 ft., $20.00; Fruit 
Trees, 7-8 ft., $12.00; also have 
large home-grown shade and 
ornamental trees at wholesale 
prices. I make deliveries to your 
area each week at no charge. 
Emert’s Nursery & Tree Service, 
806-652-3116 after 6:00 p.m. 7-tfc

Hutsell Jewelry
Now is the time to place special 
orders on layaway for those 
special occasions: Graduation, 
Mother’s Day and Father’s Day. 
Check with us first for value, 
quality, service and dependabil­
ity. Tues.-Sat., 10 a.m.-5:30 p.m. 
Call 823-2277 or 823-2087. 9-tfc

FOR SALE: 1978 MERCURY 
Monarch, 54,000 miles, excellent 
condition. $2,500.00. Ross Estes, 
823-2221. 9-tfc

MESQUITE FIREWOOD, $100 a 
cord, delivered and stacked. 
823-2221, Ross Estes. 9-tfc

PIANO FOR SALE. WANTED: 
Responsible party to assume 
small monthly payments on 
piano. See locally. Call Credit 
Manager, 1-800-447-4266. 9-ltp

TRASH BARRELS FOR SALE: 
Silverton Fire Department. Ask 
at City Hall. 31-tfnc

Terry Grimland Welding
Shop - Portable - Aluminum  

Welding - Small Engine 
Repair - Dealer for Nichols 

Sweeps & Tillage Tools 
823-2214

LET US HELP YOU  
WITH YOUR GINNING & 

COTTON MARKETING

BRISCOE 
COOPERATIVES

(§9)
This Is Your Business—Use It!

Services
SILVERTON OIL COMPANY is 
now doing light mechanic work, 
including U-Joints, Shocks, Wat- 

'er Pumps and Alternator re­
pairs. 823-2451. 3-tfc

CRP SHREDDING AND Grass 
Sowing. Hand Baird, 847-2644.

42-tfc
SINGER SEWING MACHINES, 
Vacuum Cleaners, Smith Corona 
Typewriters, Adding Machines, 
Kirby Sales and Service. Buy 
here, service here. Call in 
Silverton, 823-2333. Office loca­
ted at 620 Noel in Memphis, 
259-2716. Here every two weeks 
on Thursdays. 21-tfc
IS SOMEONE’S DRINKING 
causing you a problem? Call 
Al-Anon, 847-2619. 16-tfnc
BEFORE YOU RENEW, please 
check our rates. Lee’s Insurance, 
Phone 806-469-5370, Flomot, 
Texas. 12-tfc

WE WOULD APPRECIATE the 
opportunity to discuss your CRP 
grass seed needs. All varieties 
available. Call GRASS SEED 
SERVICES:  806-385-5229. 
Nights: Tommy Thrash, 385- 
5357; Dick Hopping, 385-3653; 
Terry Thrash, 385-4403. 6-4tc

MEMPHIS CLEANERS: PICK 
up and delivery Saturday mor­
nings only at Tiffin’s Dept. Store.

42-tfc

NEED A BABYSITTER? Call 
KAC’s Babysitters Club and 
reach three babysitters. For 
details call Kami, 823-2012; 
Christa, 823-2331; Ashleigh, 847- 
2570. Our house or yours. 9-tfnc

Real Estate
FOR SALE: TWO BEDROOM, 
one bath, fully carpeted and 
draped house. Attached garage. 
Call 823-2062. Night 214-642- 
7345. Day or night, 214-642-3608.

32-tfc

Public Notices
LOCAL INVITATION TO BID 
ON PAVEMENT MARKING
Sealed proposals for Contract 

No. 258XXM5012 for Pavement 
Marking in Briscoe, Childress, 
Cottle, Donley and Hall Counties 
will be received at the State 
Department of Highways and 
Public Transportation District 
Office at 1700 Avenue F, N.W., 
Childress, Texas 79201, until 
10:00 a.m. on March 4,1988.

The State Department of 
Highways and Public Transpor­
tation, in accordance with the 
provisions of Title VI of the Civil 
Rights Act of 1964 (78 Stat. 252) 
and the regulations of the U. S. 
Department of Transportation 
(15 C.F.R., Part 8), issued 
pursuant to such act, hereby 
notifies all bidders that it will 
affirmatively insure that the 
contract entered into pursuant to 
this advertisement will be aw­
arded to the lowest responsible 
bidder without discrimination on 
the ground of race, color, or 
national origin. 8-2tc

To our wonderful family and 
friends:

We want to thank you from the 
depths of our hearts for all the 
prayers, work, food, gifts, cards 
and phone calls on our behalf. A 
special thanks to Lynn Frizzell, 
Bro. Knowlton and our doctors 
and nurses. God bless you all.

Shafe and Jonnie Weaver

Cards of Thanks
Once again we’ve seen how 

special our community is. The 
encouragement and support of 
friends means so much. We want 
to thank each one for every act of 
kindness shown Holly during her 
surgery and stay at Houston.
The prayers, calls, flowers, 
cards, visits, and food since our 
return are all greatly appreciat­
ed.

Wayne, Tina,
Tara and Holly

We wish to thank all of our 
friends for the cards, food, visits, 
calls and prayers, and all the nice 
things done for us during my 
sickness.

May God bless each of you.
Vinson and Jerry Smith

BRISCOE COUNTY BIRTH- 
day Celebration and Rodeo is 
August 12-13 in Silverton. Make 
plans to attend. 9-18tnc

Plainview-Canyon-Farwell Triangle 
Grain Prices

|  M ilo ................................... .......................  $3L10
S W hea t.......................................................  $2 .63  |

In parts of England it was 
once believed th at seeing 
a hen and rooster through  
a keyhole on St. Valentine's 
day foretold one's marriage 
w ith in  the year.

TU RN ER W ELDING
Shop, Portable, Aluminum, & Wire Welding 

Fabrication and General Repair
B illy  Turner 823-2228 Gary Turner

| Appointments Now Being Taken |
For Car Washing Monday through Thursday at

i RICK’S MUFFLER !

BACKHOE SERVICE
New Pipeline Insta lla tion  

A ll Types Underground P ipeline Repair

G. W. Chappell
823-2504

lilHIiliK!

I
■nm e

P. O. Box 771 806 823-2074

ZIEGLER PUMP
Silverton, Texas 79257 

Domestic, Irrigation and Windmill Work 
RILEY ZIEGLER JERRY MILLER BRAD ZIEGLER
806 847-2627 806 823-216' 806 823-2242

Jo h n s o n ’s Gin Co. it
‘Your Business and Friendship AppreciatedJ

Rex and Dorothy Johnson!
Buy USA Grown & Made — It Matters!

f  Office (806) 823-2224 Home (806) 823-2223 \
f  P .O .B o x  717

Silverton, Texas 79257


