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Santa Letters To
Be Published
Send your Santa letters 

to the Times. We publish 
them and send a copy to 
the North Pole. They will 
be published in the Dec. 
23 Christmas edition.

Letters must be in the 
office by Monday, Decem-
ber 13; send them to The 
Wheeler Times, Box 1080, 
Wheeler, TX 79096 or 
wtimes@windstream.net

Michael Honeycutt

“A prophet does not profit.” 
I heard that saying today. As 
far as I could tell I had not 
heard that before, although 
I kept wanting to think that I 
had. Nevertheless, it is a pithy 
one-liner, a play on words 
which conveys truth.

A cursory review of the 
prophets mentioned in the 
Old Testament indicates their 
lives were fraught with vari-
ous degrees of hardship. That 
is an examination of the his-
torical, perhaps we might say 
formal, interpretation of the 
word prophet. Yet what is a 
prophet except one who con-
veys a message of the truth? 

Ruby Nell Garner Brad-
street who liked to be called 
Nell, Granny, Granny Grunt, 
and Queen B, was born on 
August 4, 1929, to Charlie 
and Alice Garner. She was 
one of nine children. Nell 
passed away in the home of 
her daughter in Wheeler, Tex-
as, on December 3, 2021 and 
went to her heavenly home, 
at the age of 92.

Funeral services will be 
Friday, December 10, 2021 
at 2:00 PM at First Baptist 
Church in Wheeler with Rev. 
Larry Mitchell, officiating. 
Burial will follow at Wheeler 
Cemetery.

Viewing will be held at the 
funeral home on Thursday, 
December 9th from 9:00 A.M. 
to 6:00 P.M. with family re-
ceiving friends from 4:00-6:00 
PM.

Arrangements are by Rob-
ertson Funeral Directors of 
Wheeler.

Nell married Roy Marvin 
Bradstreet on November 8, 
1947. Nell and Roy had six 
children. They lacked less 
than a month being married 
70 years when Roy passed 
away on October 13, 2013. 
They had a wonderful long 

Ruby Nell Bradstreet

Santa Clause Is Coming To Town

Michael Lynn Honeycutt, 
70, of Wheeler passed away 
on Thursday, December 2, 
2021 at his home.

Funeral services were at 
2:00 PM Monday, December 
6th at First Baptist Church 
in Wheeler with Rev. Larry 
Mitchell, officiating. Burial fol-
lowed in Wheeler Cemetery 
with military honors. Viewing 
was held at the funeral home 
in Wheeler on Sunday, De-
cember 5th from 1:00 – 6:00 
PM.

Arrangements were by 
Robertson Funeral Directors 
of Wheeler.

Michael was born in Wel-
lington, TX on June 9, 1951, 
to Glenn Honeycutt and El-
wanda Sturgill. Michael mar-
ried Ladona Burrell Hon-
eycutt on October 14, 1972. 
Former residents of Mclean, 
Michael and Ladona moved 
to Wheeler where they could 
enjoy their time surrounded 
by family. 

Michael made a career of 
his lifelong passion which 
was being a mechanic. He 
retired from National Oilwell 
in June 2012 after 20 years. 
He also served his country 
for 20 years as a member of 

Military Rites For Michael Honeycutt

the army national guard. He 
could always be found tinker-
ing around in the garage in 
his spare time. There wasn’t 
anything he couldn’t fix.  Mi-
chael also deeply loved his 
kids, grand children and ev-
eryone else he was Papa too. 
His favorite past time was 
taking all of his babies fish-
ing at his favorite spot, Sand 
Spur lake. 

Michael is preceded in 
death by his parents, Glen 
Honeycutt and Elwanda 
Sturgill; two brothers, Buster 
Newman, and Wendill Hon-
eycutt; and one sister, Alice 

Ruby Nell Bradstreet Services Friday

and loving life together. Nell 
loved to fish, camping for 
months at a time, and above 
all, loved her kids and grand-
kids.

Nell is preceded in death by 
her husband, Roy Bradstreet; 
son, Mike Bradstreet; daugh-
ter, Kathy Janzen; baby 
daughter, Tina Dawn; and 
several siblings and loved 
ones.

Nell is survived by her old-
est son, David Bradstreet of 
Wolfe City, TX; son, Wesley 
Bradstreet and wife, Cindy, of 
Wheeler, TX; daughter, Deb-
bie Glazner of Wheeler, TX; 

THIRD ROUND: Zack Hibler is shown here in his third round of riding at the National Finals 
Rodeo in Las Vegas. Zack will make 10 rides, starting last Thursday. GO ZACK!

Christmas Edition of The 
Wheeler Times will be pub-
lished December 23. 

The December 23, 2021 
edition of the paper marks 
the start of our 89th year of 
publication. 

We will begin contact busi-
nesses and individuals this 
week for their ads. If we fail 

Wheeler Times Christmas Edition
To Be Published Thurs., Dec. 23

to contact you, please contact 
us 405-200-9705.

To send us ad copy, please 
email wtimes@windstream.
net.

We are presently working 
on the Santa Letters and it is 
necessary they be to us by 
Wednesday, December 10.

Santa Claus is coming to 
town! He and Mrs. Claus 
will be at the Panhandle 
Handmade Market inside 
the Wheeler County Agrilife 
Building from 10 a.m.-2 p.m. 
this Saturday, December 11.

Take the opportunity, also 
to finish up your Christmas 
shopping with unique Arti-
sans from across the Texas 
Panhandle and Oklahoma, 
who specialize in jewelry de-
sign, home décor, baby gifts, 
toys, apparel, leather goods, 
candies and so much more. 
While you shop, your kids can 
design their own handmade 
gifts for loved ones, teachers, 

and friends in the Creative Elf 
Workshop. Proceeds will ben-
efit the Wheeler County Toys 
for Tots program.

Why not make it a day and 
visit our other shops down-
town and enjoy a meal at 
any of our local restaurants. 
They are just minutes from 
the Panhandle Handmade 
Market this Saturday from 10 
a.m. to 4 p.m. at 7939 US 83 
in Wheeler, Texas.

For more information visit 
us on Facebook at Panhan-
dle Handmade Market.

We’ll see y’all there and a 
very Merry Christmas from 
our family to yours.

Ecolomondo Initiates TDP Facility Expansion
Into US With Shamrock Site Selection

Montreal, QC—TheNews-
wire—November 30, 2021—
Ecolomondo Corporation 
(TSXV:ECM) (OTC:ECLMF) 
(the “Company” or “Ecolo-
mondo”), a cleantech com-
pany specializing in the de-
velopment of proprietary 

Binding Agreement for 136 Acre Land Purchase Underway 
With Help From Shamrock Economic Development Corpora-
tion

recycling technology, Ther-
mal Decomposition Process 
(“TDP”), and the commercial-
ization of turnkey TDP facili-
ties, today announced it has 
identified a 136.76 acre prop-
erty in Shamrock, Texas as a 
potential site location to build 

its first US-based waste-to-
resources TDP plant.

Working in close consulta-
tion with the Shamrock Eco-
nomic Development Corpo-
ration (“EDC”), Ecolomondo 
is currently negotiating a 
binding land purchase agree-
ment and expects to close on 
the transaction in the com-
ing weeks. The Company 
intends to build turnkey TDP 
recycling facilities throughout 
the United States that pro-
cess end-of-life tires (“ELT”) 
into saleable products includ-
ing recycled carbon black, oil, 
gas, steel and fiber.

Strategically situated in 
Wheeler County and close 
to major hubs such as Dal-
las and Oklahoma City, the 
land is conveniently located 
on Interstate 40, a major 
east–west Interstate Highway 
running through the south-
central portion of the United 
States. A future TDP facility 
would help service area re-
cycling needs as municipal 
and state officials move away 

Using the religious context 
of the word, a prophet is one 
who is in contact with, and 
speaking for, the divine. And 
what is the divine if it is not 
the truth? In a way it could be 
said that the quest for God is 
the quest for truth itself. The 
point I wish to make here is 
I would expand the applica-
tion of the term ‘prophet’ to 
those who speak a message 
of truth – and the term applies 
all the more when the truth is 
obscured for any number of 
reasons.

And being a prophet, i.e., 
a truth teller, does not profit. 
Since the truth is right, speak-

ing truth injures (though in re-
ality, it heals, like a medicine 
which burns when it is ap-
plied) those who would insist 
on the wrong. This makes the 
prophet’s life more difficult. 

Those who are not in the truth 
cannot tolerate the truth, or 
those who represent it. Thus 
they ensure that the prophet 
does not profit. This reality 

Work is underway on the 
Christmas Greeting Edition of 
The Wheeler Times. Copy for 
the Christmas Greeting sec-
tion of the paper will have to 
be in the office by Thursday, 
December 17. Deadline for 
the regular section of the pa-
per will be Monday morning, 
December 20 at 9:00.

— cwe —
Wheeler’s Zack Hibler is in 

Las Vegas this week compet-
ing in the World’s Champion-

Oct. Wheeler I.S.D. Board Minutes
A Regular Meeting of the 

Board of Trustees of Wheeler 
ISD was held Wednesday, 
October 20, 2021, begin-
ning at 6:30 PM in the board 
conference room located at 
#1 Mustang Drive, Wheeler, 
Texas, 79096.

Those present were:      Dr. 
Lee Ann Hillhouse, Mark 
Marshall, Billy Richardson, 
Ike Finsterwald, Machille 
Henson, Mike Houska, Beau 
Means, Bryan Markham, Su-
perintendent; Stacey Horton, 
Business Manager; Heather 
Hardcastle, Elementary Prin-
cipal; Mike Bailey, Secondary 
Principal

I.  ESTABLISH A QUORUM
a. Pledge: Ike Finsterwald 

led the pledge.
b. Invocation: Beau Means 

offered the invocation. 
II. OPEN FORUM
a. Hearing of Any Person/ 

Group Wishing to Address the 
Board: None

III. READING OF MINUTES 
a. Regular Meeting of Sep-

tember 15, 2021: Mark Mar-
shall motioned to approve 
the minutes.  Billy Richardson 
seconded the motion.  Seven 
members voted to accept the 
motion, no votes against.

IV. FINANCIAL REPORT

(Continued Page 2)

(Continued Page 2)

(Continued Page 2)

(Continued Page 2)

Dear Friends, In my Lead-
ership Class we watched the 
movie, Lean on Me. That is a 
great movie! Everyone needs 
to know that someone cares 
about them and they can suc-
ceed. I really enjoy that class. 

Saturday was my birthday 
and I had fun! We went to the 
OKC Zoo. I was a little disap-
pointed that a large part of the 
zoo was closed for construc-
tion, but my favorite thing 
made up for that. I did the 
Wildlife Encounter with the 
Sea Lions and it was amaz-
ing! I got to see them close up 

(Continued Page 5)

The “Pride of Wheeler” 
bands will perform their 
Christmas Concert Thursday, 
December 9, at 7:00 p.m. in 
the game gym.

Band  Concert
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Canadian
Redi-Mix, Inc.

. . . for all your Concrete
Needs!

806-323-5379

  Listen To . . .

KPDR-FM, 90.3
WHEELER, TEXAS

Send Us Your
Child’s
Picture

w/Name,
Age, Parents

& Grandparents

No Charge!
wtimes@windstream.net

For all your . . .
Insurance Needs, See

Eastern Panhandle
Insur. Agency, Inc.

206 N. Madden
Shamrock

806/256-5401
•Auto •Home •Life •Health

•Commercial •Bonds

Fort Elliott Elementary 
Cougars of the Week
Nov. 29 thru Dec. 3

Pre-K
Sawyer Horn

5th Grader
Reagan Gaines

Koepke Legacy
Insurance Group

1-806.570.0645

Linda Laycock
Broker, ABR,

GREEN, SRES. E-PRO
806.662.1312

— Let us list your Real Estate —
Larry Hadley

Assoc.
806.662.2779

Tisha Calhoun
Assoc.

806.440.4153

Pampa MLS  www.panhandleplainsrealty.com  Amarillo MLS

 Linda Laycock
Broker, ABR,

GREEN, SRES. E-PRO

806.662.1312

The store for all your 
Prescriptions and Gifts 

for your loved ones.

Hyland’s Pharmacy
Downtown Wheeler — 826-5561

Old Time Gospel Music
KPDR-FM, 90.3

. . . In Wheeler
Sun.: 6:00 a.m. to 8:00 a.m.

BABY SHOWER
Dustin & Brehanna 

Adams 1/29/22

Wheeler County

SWCD Annual Tree Sales
The Wheeler County Soil and 
Water Conservation District 
will be taking tree orders from 
now through March 25, 2022. 
Seedings are sold in quantities 
listed. Lots will no be broken to 
facilitate the sale of individual 
seedings. 
Bare root species available 
are, Aromatic Sumac, Bur 
Oak, Chinkapin Oak, Pecan, 
Shumard Oak, and Sand 
Plum. They are sold in mul-
tiples of 25 and priced at 
$55.00.
Containerized species avail-
able are Afghanistan Pine 

and Italian Stone Pine. They 
are sold in multiples of 25 and 
priced at $70.
Payment must accompany or-
der; no trees will be reserved 
until payment is received and 
all sales will be final; no can-
cellations or refunds. 
If you would like to place an 
order, please come by the 
Wheeler County SWCD office 
at 1410 S Alan Bean Blvd., 
Wheeler, TX. Trees will be 
available for pick up in March 
of 2022. Our office will take 
orders on Monday-Friday from 
8:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. If you 
have any questions, please 
call the Wheeler County 
SWCD at (806)826-3565 Ext. 
101. Or you can also email 
us at wheelercounty@swcd.
texas.gov.

——————————

Call today to schedule 
your covid booster! 

Walk in flu shots avail-
able.

Hyland’s Pharmacy
PO Box 230 

Wheeler, TX 79096
Phone: 806-826-5561

Windstream participates in a government benefit program called Lifeline to make residential telephone 
or broadband service more affordable to eligible low-income individuals and families. Eligible customers 
are those that meet eligibility standards as defined by the FCC and state commission. Residents who live 
on federally recognized Tribal Lands may also qualify for additional Tribal benefits if they participate in 
certain federal eligibility programs. The program offers a monthly discount limited to one discount per 
household and can either be applied to wireline or wireless. If applied to wireline the discount can be 
applied to either your voice or broadband service. The monthly discount is up to $5.25 per month for voice 
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Lifeline discount to apply, a customer must subscribe to a Windstream service that meets the minimum 
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a. Review of Bills: Mr. 
Markham reviewed the bills.

b. Financial Statement(s): 
Mrs. Horton provided the fi-
nancial statements through 
October 19, 2021.

c. Financial Assumptions: 
Mr. Markham provided the fi-
nancial assumptions with cur-
rent data.  Assumptions esti-
mate a $300,000 deficit.  

V. REPORTS/DISCUS-
SION ITEMS 

a. Principals’ Reports: Mrs. 
Hardcastle reported an in-
crease in elementary enroll-
ment for the month, elemen-
tary WOWW programs, Fire 
Prevention Week, and the 
Wheeler County Ag Day.  

Mr. Bailey reported steady 
enrollment, HS Band advanc-
ing to the Area Contest, HS 
Boys Cross Country advanc-

ing to Regionals, the weekly 
video announcements by 
the digital media class, and 
upcoming activities for the 
months of October and No-
vember.

VI. ACTION ITEMS
a. Unfinished Business: 1. 

No Unfinished Business
b. New Business: 1.Consid-

er/Approve District Financial 
Audit for 2020-2021

Mike Houska made a mo-
tion to table the district finan-
cial audit.  Ike Finsterwald 
seconded the motion.  Seven 
members voted to approve 
the motion, no votes against.

VII. SUPERINTENDENT’S 

REPORT 
a. Covid-19 Update: Mr. 

Markham reported that the 
last case was confirmed on 
October 3rd and that we have 
been relatively stable for the 
past few weeks.

b. Depository Contract 
Amendment: Mr. Markham 
reported that Wellington 
State Bank had provided an 
amendment that included an 
increase in interest for the re-
mainder of the contract. 

c. Bond Sale Update: Mr. 
Markham reported that the re-
sale of bonds went very well.  
With the resale, the District 
looks to save approximately 
$900,000 over the duration of 
the payment schedule.

d. Review November Meet-
ing Date 

The Regular November 
Board Meeting will be held 
November 17th at 6:30.

VIII. EXECUTIVE SES-
SION

a. If Needed, According 
to Texas Government Code 
Section 551.001, et seq.: The 
Board Did Not Enter Execu-
tive Session.

b. Consider/Take Action on 
Resignations/Hiring of Per-
sonnel

IX. ADJOURNMENT
Mark Marshall motioned 

to adjourn at 7:01 pm.  Billy 
Richardson seconded the  
motion.  Seven members vot-
ed to accept the motion, no 
votes against.

Board         (from Page 1) 

TDP              (from Page 1) 

MAINTENANCE: Kristen 
Moudy is shown here water-
ing the planter boxes on the 
square. Kristen hauled the 
water in her vehicle and used 
a container until Dr. Ben Ed 
Hillhouse provided her with a 
4-wheeler and water hauler.

from tire burning, landfilling 
and shredding.

“Industry executives and 
governments throughout 
North America are embrac-
ing the notion of Extended 
Producer Responsibility pro-
grams, but need solutions 
in place to take back and 
responsibly recycle end-of-
of-life products,” said Eliot 
Sorella, Chairman and Chief 
Executive Officer of Ecolo-
mondo “Forward thinking 
leaders like Shamrock’s EDC 
are acting both smartly and 
responsibly as they consider 
and push for positive change 
and increased economic ac-
tivity. We plan to be a great 
partner to Shamrock and sur-
rounding communities.”  

The planned land purchase 
and TDP facility construction 
in Shamrock, TX marks the 
start of a key commitment in 
Ecolomondo’s strategic plans 
to expand its waste manage-
ment operations globally and 
aggressively. The Company’s 
Hawkesbury, Ontario TDP 
turnkey facility will soon be 
commissioned and will incor-
porate all of the technological 
advancements developed at 
the Pilot facility in Contre-
coeur, Quebec, Canada.

Additional updates on the 
Texas land purchase and fa-
cility will be forthcoming. The 
Company will take all ap-
propriate steps to notify the 
Market and shareholders as 
events occur.  Visit the Com-
pany’s website at www.ecolo-
mondo.com to learn more.

About TDP Technology
 Thermal Decomposition 

Process technology is a pro-
prietary waste-to-resources 
technology that the Compa-
ny expects will play a critical 
role in the development and 
proliferation of the circular 
economy. TDP is a closed 
loop, slow pyrolysis technol-
ogy that operates in an oxy-
gen-free environment using 
positive pressure and a batch 
rotary reactor. The process is 
largely energy self-sufficient. 
Ecolomondo’s exclusive au-
tomation system allows for 
strict control of cycle times, 
processing parameters and 
consistent batch production, 
resulting in quality, commer-
cial-grade recycled commodi-
ties and end-products.

—————————

applies to each of us in some 
way or another. In one way or 
another, we all deviate from 
the truth in our lives, whether 
that takes place in the form 
of excuses we tell ourselves 
or that we tell others, or ra-
tionalizations we might make 
as to why a certain decision 
is acceptable. And these ar-
eas are the fertile fields for 
the prophets in our lives, to 
come in with the instrument 
of the truth, as sharp as a 
scalpel, and cut away the 
lies that bind. And when this 
happens, we might make the 
prophet’s life more difficult 
for their service. Inversely, at 
times we may be the prophet 
who speaks truth to others, 
and receive hardship as rec-
ompense. Whether we are 
dishing it out or receiving, it’s 
just the day’s wage for the un-
profitable prophet.

—————————

Merely       (from Page 1) 

Brown.
Survivors include his wife, 

Ladona Honeycutt; 3 sons, 
David Halencak, Heath Hon-
eycutt and Gavin Honeyc-
utt; two daughters, Heather 
Bridges and Kaydense Hon-
eycutt; 2 brothers, Danny 
Honeycutt and Terry Honeyc-
utt; 4 sisters, Bonnie Cross, 
Lafonda Darnall, Glenda 
Albus and Sandra Pend-
ergrass; 9 grandchildren, 
Courtney Honeycutt, Ashtyn 
Quesada, Chanceton Rob-
erts, Quinlan Doulas, Jade 
Honeycutt, Emmi Schmitt, 
Sara Honeycutt, Preston 
Todd and Colton Halencak; 
and 10 great-grandchildren, 
Raydon Quesada, Tayson 
Quesada, Lyrix Quesada, 
Dean Roberts, Amelia Rob-
erts, Logan Roberts, Sterling 
Todd, Kingston Todd, Roman 
Todd and Kaz Honeycutt. 

In lieu of flowers, donations 
may be made to Pregnancy 
Support Center and Hope in 
Pampa, Texas.

Sign our online guestbook 
at robertsonfuneral.com.

Michael   (from Page 1) 

son-in-love, Paul Janzen of 
Salida, CO; daughter-in-love, 
Jan Bradstreet of Edmond, 
OK; sister, Betty McCoy of 
Weslaco, TX; 92 year old 
twins, lifetime friends, and 
sisters-in-love, Floy Larkin 
and Joy Garrison both of Lake 
Jackson, TX; 13 grandchil-
dren; 29 great-grandchildren; 
18 great-great grandchildren; 
and lots of nieces, nephews, 
and friends that loved her like 
a mother and granny.

Sign our online guestbook 
at robertsonfuneral.com.

Nell             (from Page 1) 

Did you know why to put dif-
ferent oils in and on the belly 
button? 

Our Navel (Nabhi), is an 
amazing gift that our Creator 
has given us. According to 
science, the first part created 
after conception is the navel. 
After it is created, it joins the 
mother’s placenta through the 
umbilical cord.

Our Navel is surely an 
amazing thing! All our veins 
are connected to our navel, 
which makes it the focal point 
of our body. The belly button 
is life itself!

The “Pechoti” is behind 
the navel, which has more 
than 72,000 veins. The total 
amount of blood vessels we 
have in our body is equal to 
double the circumference of 
the earth.

We knew that to lower the 
temperature to the babies, we 
put a cotton swab with alco-
hol in the navel, now we know 
that with oil, it’s better.

. Apply Mustard Oil in your 
belly button - to get rid of dry, 
chapped lips. Will also keep 
your intestines moving to re-
move harmful bacteria but 
keep the good. Actually works 
as a mild detox.

. Apply olive oil or coconut 
oil - to improve your fertility

Keep alcohol dipped cot-
ton on your belly button - to 
cure a cold, flu and a running 
nose. When a baby has stom-
ach pain, we put a few drops 
directly in the navel and we 
give the massage around the 
naval a few minutes, the pain 
is cured. Oil works the same 
way.

Keep brandy-soaked cot-
ton ball on your belly button 
- to ease menstrual pain and 
cramps

Sesame Oil is used for all 
types of joint pains. It is also 
known to strengthen bones. 
Many parents use in their chil-
dren every night at bedtime.

Use an equal amount of 
Mustard Oil And Ginger Oil 
For Upset Stomach, Bloating, 
Nausea and digestive prob-
lems.

Using Warm Ghee improves 
blood flow to the nervous sys-
tem and also enhances the 
immunity system.

Different Oils In
Belly Button

Two blondes were going to 
Disneyland. They were driv-
ing on the Interstate when 
they saw the sign that said 
Disneyland LEFT. They start-
ed crying and turned around 
and went home

A blonde was playing Trivial 
Pursuit one night. It was her  
turn.  She rolled the dice and 
she landed on Science & Na-
ture. 

Her question was, ‘If you 
are in a vacuum and someone 
calls your name, can you hear 
it?’ She thought for a time and 
then asked, ‘Is it on or off?’* 

As you get older, you’ll re-
alize that a $300 watch and a 
$30 watch both tell the same 
time.

A Michael Kors wallet and 
a Forever 21 wallet hold the 
same amount of money.
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Hear the
“Abundant Living Broadcast”

KPDR-FM, 90.3
WHEELER, TEXAS
Saturdays: 9:00 a.m. to Noon

Sunday Nite Live
KPDR-FM, 90.3

. . . Live from Wheeler
8:00 p.m. to 9:00 p.m.

This fantastic holiday light display can be 
viewed nightly from 6-11 p.m. and 

concludes on New Year's Eve. 
With wonderful sponsors and donations 
merrily accepted from visitors, Christmas 

in the Park is a holiday tradition!

This fantastic holiday light display can be 
viewed nightly from 6-11 p.m. and 

concludes on New Year's Eve. 
With wonderful sponsors and donations 
merrily accepted from visitors, Christmas 

in the Park is a holiday tradition!

November 26th - December 31st 

Free Activities Every Fri. & Sat. 6-9 PM • Nov. 26th - Dec. 18th

580.225.0207 • elkcitychamber.com
Please give to a local charity

Participating
Businesses:

Thousands of dollars in Gifts and Chamber Dollars 
to be Given Away December 15th & 16th

580 Threads
Barber-Dyson Ford Lincoln
Behind the Seams
Bella Vita
BTB’s Records & Rarities
Carrol’s Shoe Corner
Currell’s Do It Center
Damron Jewelers
Davis Printing Co.
DJ’s Rentals and Sales 
Doug Gray Auto Group
Dr.’s Bintz and Ellis
Elk City News 
Elk City Pick-A-Part

Faith + Jo
Fat Cat Designs
Galleria Furniture Outlet
Garage Bicycle Works
Grandview Pharmacy
Hylton’s Flowers & Gift 
Keith’s Butcher Shop
Kilhoffer Flooring Center
LaDonna’s Wine & Spirits
L&R Tire & Truck Service 
Main Street Coffee & 
 Café
McAlary ATV & Cycle
Merrifield Office Supply

Midwest Farm Supply 
Mostly Mail
Mountain Man’s Axe 
 Throwing & Grub
Oak Creek Floral & Gifts
Page Jewelers
Paul Jones Drug
Pizza Hut
Quick & Easy 
Roger’s Meat Market
S&S Quality Carpet
Sears
Terry’s Furniture 
 Showroom

The Attic Door
The Everett Blake Society 
The Natural Way Dispensary
The Tool Box
The Vogue Boutique 
The Zoo 101.7
Cell Only - Verizon
Z n’ R Snack Bar

Special  Holiday 
Drawing 

Dec. 16th  @ 8 p.m. 
MAIN STREET 

COFFEE & CAFE
> MUST BE PRESENT TO WIN <

Activities Start @ 6 pm
Retail District 

• Santa & Mrs. Claus 
• Ponce Productions
• Carolers

STOP shop STOP shop 

> Need not be present to win Dec. 16th drawing <

Limited Edition
Christmas
Ornaments
Christmas
Ornaments
Christmas
Ornaments
Make it a Tradition!

Ornaments can be 
purchased at the 

Chamber of Commerce, 
Transportation Museum, 
City Hall and the Ginger 

Bread Gift Shop on Friday 
and Saturday Evenings 
at Christmas in the Park.

November 26-28
Untitled Pop Up Theatre 

“Its a Wonderful Life”
Nightly at 7:30pm • Sunday at 2:30 pm

Museum Opera House

Homestead of 
Elk City/Elkwood

serving Popcorn and 
Apple Cider

First 3 Weekends • 6-9pm
 Christmas in the Park

The Way Church
Community  Candle 

Light Service 
Ackley Park Tennis Courts
December 17th 

7:30 pm

• Tour the Park on the Mistletoe
   Express, a Double Decker Bus
• Visit Santa at Santa's Park Place
• Candycane Express
   Miniature Train Rides
• Ride the Centennial Carousel
• Holly Jolly Trolley Rides
• Cub Scouts Serving Hot Chocolate

$2000$2000

$100 Gift$100 Gift
Nov. 18th-
Dec. 15th
Nov. 18th-
Dec. 15th

P.E.O. Chapter DY – 
Gift Wrapping in December 

Wed.-Fri. 2-6 pm, Sat. 1-4 pm
118 South Main

Retail District 
Stores Open Late
FRIDAY UNTIL 7 PM

Dec. 16th and 23rd

Red Carpet Community Theatre

“A Christmas Carol” 
Dec. 3-5 & 10-12

Saturday, Nov. 27 at City Hall

Christmas Tree Lighting
& Christmas Parade to
Ackley Park • 5:30 pm

Wheeler County Sheriff’s Report

Texas Comptroller Glenn 
Hegar Announces Transfer of 
$2.9 Billion to State Highway 
and Rainy Day Funds

Texas Comptroller Glenn 
Hegar announced today he 
recently completed the trans-
fer of more than $2.91 billion 
into the State Highway Fund 
(SHF) and the Economic Sta-
bilization Fund (ESF; com-
monly known as the “Rainy 
Day Fund”). Each fund re-
ceived nearly $1.46 billion, or 
50 percent of the total trans-
fer.

“The Rainy Day Fund and 
the State Highway Fund are 
key components of Texas’ 
long-term economic success 
and help provide the foun-
dation needed for our future 
growth,” Hegar said. “Texas 
is experiencing a strong eco-
nomic recovery, and our pop-
ulation continues to boom as 
more and more people and 
businesses seek out the jobs 
and opportunities created 
here in Texas. It is critical that 
we continue to invest in the in-
frastructure needed to main-
tain our fiscal health and keep 
our economy growing while at 
the same time acknowledging 
the uncertainty that remains 
and setting aside dollars to 
ensure we are able to weath-

er future downturns.”
The transfer amounts 

are based on crude oil and 
natural gas production tax 
revenues in excess of 1987 
collections. If either tax gen-
erates more revenue than the 
1987 threshold, an amount 
equal to 75 percent of the ex-
cess is transferred.

In November 2014, vot-
ers approved a constitutional 
amendment allocating at 
least half of these severance 
taxes to the ESF, with the re-
mainder going to the SHF for 
use on non-toll highway con-
struction, maintenance and 
right-of-way acquisition. 

According to the Texas 
Constitution, the ESF transfer 
must occur within 90 days af-
ter the end of the fiscal year. 
When fiscal 2021 ended on 
Aug. 31, the ESF balance 
was $10.3 billion.

With this most recent trans-
fer, the new balance will be 
about $11.4 billion, not ac-
counting for currently out-
standing spending author-
ity of approximately $1.43 
billion. The balance in the 
ESF will change as agencies 
spend down this remaining 
appropriation authority and 
investment earnings are real-
ized.

Texas Comptroller Transfers Money To SHF & ESF
Quinn Minute

Chrismas Trees
by Rix Quinn

Christmas trees are like a 
distant cousin. They come to 
your house, surround them-
selves with presents, and 
stay a month. Then they be-
gin to shed, and need some-
body to drive them off.

People often do strange 
things with cut trees. One of 
my neighbors pulled out a 
chain saw and widened his 
front door three feet. That 
allowed him to bring in the 
tree without bending it, and 
it made a great spectacle the 
neighbors could video.

Once inside the home, 
some people say you should 
cut a couple inches off the 
base of a live tree trunk, and 
immerse it in a tree stand 
filled with water.

If your tree’s artificial, it 
doesn’t need water. And if 
you cut anything off its trunk, 
you’ll have a shorter tree next 
year.

Do not use flammable dec-
orations on a tree. The new 
smaller, safer tree lights seem 
better. I even saw one guy try 
to wear these lights to a party, 
but his extension cord kept 
coming out.

Some people surround the 
tree with a decorative tree 
skirt. I have never worn a tree 
skirt to a party, because I do 
not shave my legs.

After the holidays, dispose 
of your tree properly. Many 
cities will remove it from 
your lawn, and recycle it into 
mulch.

Therefore, do not dispose 
of your artificial tree. Plastic 
mulch will not grow anything.

Simple Answer 
To Complex
 Problems?

by Rix Quinn
     Several years ago, my Dad 
bowed his head during an 
outdoor funeral. As he did so,  
a gravestone caught his eye.
     It showed a name, and birth-
and-death dates. But beneath 
those markings were these 
three words:
     “He grew peaches.”
     Throughout the service, 
Dad said could think only this 
single thought: “Wow…one 
man’s life summed up in three 
words.”
     How many of us could de-
fine our current busy lives in 
1000 words? Or just 500? My 
guess is…not many.
     Do we compartmental-
ize famous people? When 
I say George Washington, 
is your major thought “First 
President?” Or if I say Thomas 
Edison, do you think “Invented 
the light bulb?”
     Most of us remember only 
a few things about the famous 
people. But, strangely, the less 
we know about each, the lon-
ger we remember them.
    Bottom line: No matter how 
smart we are – or how many 
degrees we’ve earned – we 
instinctively look for simple 
solutions, or techniques to 
save time and money.
     In short…we all naturally 
simplifiers.
Inventor of simplicity?
     Around 600 b.c. the Greek 
slave Aesop began to chron-
icle fables from around the 
civilized world. He became so 

State Sales Tax Revenue 
Totaled $3.6 Billion in No-
vember

(AUSTIN) — Texas Comp-
troller Glenn Hegar today 
said state sales tax revenue 
totaled $3.56 billion in No-
vember, 19.4 percent more 
than in November 2020. The 
majority of November sales 
tax revenue is based on sales 
made in October and remitted 
to the agency in November.

Year-over-year increases 
for most tax revenues contin-
ue to be affected by base ef-
fects: Year-ago revenue col-
lections to which this year’s 
collections are compared 
were suppressed by the pan-
demic. Compared to Novem-
ber 2019, sales tax collec-
tions were up 11.8 percent.

“November sales tax col-
lections once again reached 
a new monthly high,” Hegar 
said. “Texas continues to see 
growth in taxable sales in ev-
ery major economic sector.

“Sales tax remittances from 
the construction, manufactur-
ing and wholesale trade sec-
tors had substantial growth 
compared to last year, indi-
cating increased economic 
activity in the state despite 
continuing supply chain or 
labor shortage issues. In-
creased drilling drove higher 
collections from the oil and 
gas mining sector, though still 
remaining significantly below 
pre-pandemic levels.

“Collections from the retail 
trade sector remained strong 
in November, as they have 
been for most of the pandem-
ic. Receipts from electronics 
and appliance stores had the 
sharpest increase compared 
to a year ago, while receipts 
from home improvement and 
furniture and home furnishing 
stores, already elevated last 
year by pandemic-induced 
shifts in consumer spending, 
again had double-digit per-
centage gains from a year 
ago. Receipts from clothing 
stores and sporting goods 
stores also had double-digit 
gains. Growth in spending at 
online merchandisers slowed 
in comparison to other sec-

$3.6 Billion In Nov. Sales Tax
tors but still achieved growth 
year-over-year.

“The restaurant and service 
sectors continued their high 
growth compared to a year 
ago as Texans increasingly 
return to enjoying food and 
activities away from home. 
Receipts from the information 
sector also had strong growth 
over a year ago.”

Total sales tax revenue 
for the three months ending 
in November 2021 was up 
22.2 percent compared to 
the same period a year ago 
and 15.7 percent compared 
to 2019. Sales tax is the larg-
est source of state funding for 
the state budget, accounting 
for 59 percent of all tax col-
lections.

Texas collected the follow-
ing revenue from other major 
taxes, most of which were up 
sharply from a year ago due 
to base effects:

motor vehicle sales and 
rental taxes — $518 million; 
up 25 percent from Novem-
ber 2020, and up 23 percent 
from November 2019;

motor fuel taxes — $334 
million, up 3 percent from No-
vember 2020, and up 2 per-
cent from November 2019;

oil production tax — $480 
million, up 141 percent from 
November 2020, and up 
39 percent from November 
2019;

natural gas production tax 
— $291 million, up 282 per-
cent from November 2020, 
and up 143 percent from No-
vember 2019;

hotel occupancy tax — $58 
million, up 78 percent from 
November 2020, and down 
4 percent from November 
2019; and

alcoholic beverage taxes — 
$141 million, up 47 percent 
from November 2020, and up 
19 percent from November 
2019. 

For details on all monthly 
collections, visit the Comp-
troller’s Monthly State Reve-
nue Watch. For an extensive 
history of tax policy develop-
ments and fees since 1972, 
visit our updated Sources of 
Revenue publication.

——————————famous his master freed him, 
and he traveled many places 
to share stories with both kings 
and commoners.
     His stories—like the one 
about the tortoise and the 
hare—gave animals human 
qualities. His fables pointed 
out people’s good and bad 
traits and illustrated critical life 
lessons. And many were very 
short…only a few hundred 
words.
     And don’t forget Sophocles, 
another author with no last 
name. He created plays that 
usually centered on a single 
heroic character who—in order 
to help humankind—chose an 
unpopular course of action.
     Sophocles introduces us to 
(1) the popularity of contrarian 
thinking and (2) the value of 
building a story around a hero.

For icy steps and side-
walks in freezing tempera-
tures: 

Mix 1 teaspoon of Dawn 
dish soap, 1 tablespoon of 
rubbing alcohol and 1/2 gal-
lon of hot water. The combi-
nation of the dish soap, rub-
bing alcohol and hot water 
helps prevent further icing, 
speeds up the melting pro-
cess and keeps them from re-
freezing. Bonus use: put the 
mixture in a spray bottle and 
spritz it on your car windows 
to melt away ice. But be sure 
not to pour hot water on your 
windshield. That can cause 
your windshield to crack.

——————————
Couth Syrup Recipe
1 cup honey, 1 tsp cinna-

mon, 1/4 cup vinegar; 1/4 
tsp alum, 1/4-1/2 cup whis-
key.

Boil honey, cinnamon, vin-
egar and alum. Stir, remove 
from heat. Cool, Stir in whis-
key. Pour into large bottle. 
Shake well before using.

POTATO SACKS EXERCISE
With 5 lb potato sacks in each 

hand, extend your arms horizon-
tally and hold for one minute, 
then relax.

Each day you’ll find that you 
can hold this position a little lon-
ger, 1 minute, then 2, 3, 4....

After 2 weeks, move up to 10 
lb potato sacks.

After 1 month try 50 lb potato 
sacks.......

Eventually, you will be able to 
lift 100 lb sacks in each hand, 
holding your arms straight for 1 
minute, or maybe even 2 min-
utes.

After you feel confident at 
this level.....put a potato in each 
sack!!!!
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Chad Helton Owner
896-826-5759

714 W. Okla. Ave.
Wheeler, TX 79096

Across
1. Rival of 49 down
5. Communicate silently
9. Place to relax
12. Birdlike
14. Game on horseback
15. Mountaintop
16. Old-fashioned

33. Rolling in dough
37. The whole shebang
38. Pen filler
39. Refinable rock

59. Pudding fruit
61. Disgrace
62. Cybercafe patron
63. Life saver
64. Bridal-veil material
65. Drill insertion
66. Pull hard
67. Hammer’s end

Down
1. Grumble
2. Finito
3. Toy with a tail
4. Half a winter pair
5 .  C o w b o y  b o o t 
attachment
6. Charge carrier
7. Smooth-talking
8. Worth remembering

9. Done for
10. Christmas wish
11. Bridge toll unit
13. Bing, bang or boom
15. Personification
20. Nobleman
22. Car nut
25. Secretive sort
26. Unctuous
27. Experienced
28. Take by force
29. Cockeyed
32. Hill dweller
34. Small amount
35. Mountaineer’s challenge
36. Roll call response
41. Computer troublemaker
42. Wither away
43. Battery unit
44. Go faster
46. Tennis court divider
48. A prejudiced person
49. Cola competitor of 1 across
50. Black ink item
52. Apply paint crudely
53. “Guilty,” e.g.
54. Run ___ (go wild)
55. Digestive juice
56. Be a monarch
57. Prayer’s end
60. Coffee holder

17. Newton, e.g.
18. Calf’s meat
19. Canadian province 
leader
21. ATM readout
23. “Give ___ break!”
24. Montana city
25. Strongboxes
29. Pond dweller
30. Willing, old-style
31. Renter’s paper

40. Don’t believe it
42. Ancient Mexican
44. Christmas tree topper
45. Some chips, maybe
47. Online site
49. Harness racer
51. Golf ball position
52. Windows work area
5 4 .  A  b r a n c h  o f 
mathematics
58. Vaulted recess

Chad Helton, Owner
806-826-5759

714 W. Okla. Ave.
Wheeler, TX 79096

Bowie • Canadian • Childress • Dalhart • Littlefield • Olton 
• Memphis • Wheeler • Wellington
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WANT ADS/
LEGAL 

NOTICES
   Sell it through a Classified in 

THE WHEELER TIMES!
$6 for the first 20 words; 35c 

for each additional word.
Legal Notices: 35c per word.

THE
BUSINESS DIRECTORY

It pays to Advertise
in

The Wheeler Times
Phone & Fax: 826-3123

wtimes@centramedia.net

★ 24 Hr. Gas & Diesel ★ Convenience Store
★ Hunt Bros. Pizza

301  E. Oklahoma St.
Wheeler, TX

Phone: 806-826-2276
Dale & Monica Kidd

Classified:
Cash—$4.00 for first 20 words
Charge—$6.00 for first 20 words
15¢ for each additional word
Open Rate: $2.50 Per Col. In.

Card of Thanks:$5.00

MEMBER
2009

Entered as second-class matter December 18, 1933, at the Post
Office at Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879.

P.O. Box 1080
Wheeler, Texas 79096
Phone: 806/826-3123

Postmaster: Send Address changes to The Wheeler Times,
P.O. Box 1080, Wheeler, TX 79096-1080 —

wtimes@centramedia.net
Louis C. Stas, Owner & Publisher

SUBSCRIPTION RATES:
Wheeler County...$20.00 Outside County...$22.00

2011

Within Wheeler Co: $22.00 Elsewhere: $25.00

wtimes@windstream.net

It pays to Advertise
in

The Wheeler Times
Phone & Fax: 806/826-3123
wtimes@windstream.net
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Cash-$6.00 for 1st 20 wds.
Chg.-$6.50 for 1st 20 wds.

35c for each additional word
Display  Classified: $6.50pci

Card of Thanks: $7.00

It pays to Advertise in

Phone & Fax: 806/826-3125
wtimes@windstream.net

“Wheeler; town of friendship and pride.”

2021

NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC
Any erroneous reflection upon 

the character, standing or repu-
tation of any person, firm or cor-
poration, which may appear in 
the columns of this paper will be 
gladly corrected upon due notice 
being given to the editor per-
sonally at the office at Wheeler, 
Texas.
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News, Views & Comentary
KPDR-FM, 90.3

WHEELER, TEXAS
Weekdays: 6:00 a.m. to 7:00 a.m.

TxCDBG #72205021.
Immediately following the 

closing time for receipt of 
Bids, Proposals will be pub-
licly opened and read aloud 
at Wheeler City Hall. Any Bid 
received after closing time 
will be returned unopened. 
Bids will be tabulated and 
presented to City of Wheeler 
for action at a later date. The 
City of Wheeler reserves the 
right to reject any or all Bids 
or waive any informalities in 
bidding. Bids may be held by 
the City of Wheeler not to ex-
ceed 30 days from the date 
of the Bid opening to review 
Bids and investigate Bidder 
qualifications before Contract 
award.

Information for Bidders, 
Proposal forms, Specifica-
tions, and Plans are on file at 
City of Wheeler and the office 
of Parkhill, Consulting Engi-
neers, 800 S. Polk, Suite 200, 
Amarillo, Texas, 79101.

Attention is called to the 
fact that not less than the fed-
erally-determined prevailing 
(David-Bacon and Related 
Acts) wage rate, as issued by 
the Texas Department of Agri-
culture Office of Rural Affairs 
and contained in Contract 
Documents, must be paid 
on this Project. In addition, 
the successful Bidder must 
ensure employees and ap-
plicants for employment are 
not discriminated against be-
cause of race, color, religion, 
sex, sexual identity, gender 
identity, or national origin. 

Bidders must submit a Ca-
shier’s or Certified Check is-
sued by a bank satisfactory 
to the Owner, or a Proposal 
Bond from a reliable Surety 
Company, payable without 
recourse to the order of City 
of Wheeler in an amount not 
less than five percent of the 
Bid submitted as a guaranty 
that the Bidder will enter 
into a Contract and execute 
bonds in the forms provided 
within 15 days after notice 
of award of Contract to him. 
Bids without the required 
check or Proposal Bond will 
not be considered.

All contractors/subcon-
tractors that are debarred, 
suspended, or otherwise ex-
cluded from, or ineligible for 
participation on federal as-
sistance programs, may not 
undertake any activity in part 
or in full under this Project. 

The successful Bidder 
will be required to furnish a 
Performance Bond and a 

Payment Bond, each in the 
amount of the contract, writ-
ten by a responsible Surety 
Company authorized to do 
business in the State of Tex-
as, and satisfactory to the 
Owner, as required by Article 
5160, V.A.T.C.S., as amend-
ed by H.B.344, passed by 
the 56th Legislature, Regular 
Session 1959.

Bidders are expected to in-
spect the Site of the Work and 
to inform themselves regard-
ing all local conditions.

Copies of the Plans, Speci-
fications and Contract Docu-
ments may be secured at the 
office of Parkhill, Consulting 
Engineers, 800 S. Polk, Suite 
200, Amarillo, Texas, 79101 
(Phone 806-376-8600) as fol-
lows:

1. Download documents 
(.pdf file extension format) 
from Parkhill’s Info Exchange 
web site after registering as 
a plan holder with issuing 
Parkhill office. There is no 
cost or deposit required for 
this option.

2. One set of paper copies 
for a non-refundable deposit 
of $50.00.

3. A digital copy (.pdf file 
extension format) upon a 
non-refundable deposit of 
$20.00 per each CD.

Deposit shall be Company 
check or cashiers’ check 
made payable to Parkhill. No 
partial sets will be issued.

Contracting Officer: Alex 
Guerrero, Panhandle Re-
gional Planning Commission.

12/2-9

DOCUMENT 00 11 13 
- ADVERTISEMENT

Sealed Proposals ad-
dressed to The Honorable 
Bob McCain, City of Wheeler 
will be received at Wheeler 
City Hall, P.O. Box 98, Wheel-
er, Texas 79096 until Janu-
ary 13, 2022, at 2:00 PM for 
City of Wheeler TxCDBG El-
evated Storage Tank Project, 

TexSCAN Week of 
Dec. 5-11, 2021

ACREAGE
Hunting/investment/recreational property. Starting 
at $650/acre. Trans Pecos region. Also the Hill Country 
(Edwards, Menard, Coke, Val Verde Counties - 
free ranging exotics), South Texas (Duval County 
- whitetail, hogs). Large or small acreage. 30-year 
fixed rate owner financing, only 5% down. Call 
toll-free or email for individual prices and terms, 
www.ranchenterprisesltd.com, 800-876-9720.

ANIMAL CARE
Use Seal N Heal® to seal wounds on dogs & cats with 
a bitter taste to prevent gnawing, allow healing. At 
Tractor Supply® (www.fleabeacon.com).

EVENTS
Bob’s Baseball Tours – Field of Dreams Tour Aug. 
15-21, 2022: Home games for Chicago (Cubs/White 
Sox), Brewers and Twins. Also a visit to the Field of 
Dreams movie site. Tour begins/ends in Minnesota. 
New York/New England Fall Foliage Tour Sept. 
26-Oct. 2, 2022: Home games for New York (Yankees/
Mets) and Red Sox. Guided Tour of NYC, free time 
in Boston, Trolley Tour in Maine, travel through 
White Mountain National Forest in New Hampshire 
& scenic train ride in Vermont. Tour begins/ends 
in Newark, NJ. Tours include deluxe motor coach 
transportation, additional sightseeing opportunities and 
quality game tickets/hotels. Call for a FREE brochure: 
507-217-1326.

AUCTIONS
2 Day Firearms Auction Live & Online, December 
10th at 2 p.m. and December 11th at 10 a.m. 
1500+ lots, military, sporting & modern firearms. 
www.montroseauction.com, 478-376-4559. GAL2006.

GENERATORS
GENERAC Standby Generators provide backup 
power during utility power outages, so your home and 
family stay safe and comfortable. Prepare now. Free 
7-year extended warranty ($695 value!). Request a free 
quote today! Call for additional terms and conditions. 
1-855-704-8579.

MEDICAL
Portable Oxygen Concentrator May Be Covered by 
Medicare! Reclaim independence and mobility with the 
compact design and long-lasting battery of Inogen One. 
Free information kit! Call 866-747-9983.

Life Alert. One press of a button sends help FAST, 
24/7! At home and on the go. Mobile Pendant with 
GPS. FREE First Aid Kit (with subscription.) CALL 
844-831-1525. FREE Brochure.

DENTAL INSURANCE from Physicians Mutual 
Insurance Company. Coverage for 350 plus proce-
dures. Real dental insurance - NOT just a discount 
plan. Do not wait! Call now! Get your FREE Dental 
Information Kit with all the details! 1-855-901-0467 
www.dental50plus.com/txpress   #6258

WANTED
BUYING Early Texas Art, www.texaspaintings.com. 
Fine Arts of Texas, Inc., San Antonio, Texas. Call 
210-408-7778. 

Need Extra Cash – I Buy RVs & Mobile Homes 
–Travel Trailers, 5th Wheels, Goosenecks, Bumper 
Pulls. In Any Area, Any Condition – Old/New, Dirty 
or Clean! I PAY CA$H. No Title – No Problem, we 
can apply for one. ANR Enterprises, 956-466-7001.

Texas Press Statewide Classified Network 
221 Participating Texas Newspapers • Regional Ads

Start At $250 • Email ads@texaspress.com
NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We 
urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, contact the Texas Attorney General at 800-621-0508 or the 
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Week of November 22-28, 
2021
Intents to Drill
ROBERTS (ST. CLAIR, Gran-
ite Wash) Texakoma E & P, 
LLC,  #409 McMordie, (320 
acres) 1512’ FWL & 1027’ 
FSL, Sec 9, Blk A2, EL&RR 
RR Surv, A-455, 15 mi NW 
from Miami TD 9800’, (sgd. 
Jeff Harwell 972-212-8028) 
Vertical
MOORE (PANHANDLE, 
WEST) Scout Energy Man-
agement LLC,  #3B R. S. 
Coon, (27680 acres) 330’ 
FNL & 503’ FEL, Sec 3, Blk 
6T, T&NO RR Surv, A-322, 
8.65 mi SW from Dumas TD 
4000’, (sgd. Tonya Blanchard 
972-782-4267) Vertical
MOORE (PANHANDLE, 
WEST) Scout Energy Man-
agement LLC,  #12C Gober, 
(1760 acres) 1792’ FSL & 466’ 
FWL, Sec 12, Blk 1, J. Pointe-
vent Surv, A-, 9.5 mi SE from 
Dumas TD 4000’, (sgd. Tonya 
Blanchard 972-782-4267) 
Vertical
MOORE (PANHANDLE, 
WEST) Scout Energy Man-
agement LLC,  #M 1B Haile, 
(640 acres) 1525’ FNL & 2038’ 
FEL, Sec 1, Blk 1PD, B Quar-
ton Surv, A-1052, 13.91 mi SE 
from Dumas TD 4000’, (sgd. 
Tonya Blanchard 972-782-
4267) Vertical
Gas Completions
None
Oil Completions
None

Wheeler County
COURT RECORDS

List of instruments filed in the 
Wheeler County Clerk’s office 
from November 29, 2021 to 
December 3, 2021.
NOVEMBER 29, 2021
C/C PROBATE-James Delton 
Bolz Sr. to Ex Parte 11-16-21.
ASSIGN. CONVEY. BILL of 
SALE-Laura G. Ross, et al to 
Andral LLC, et al, 11-22-21, 
See Instrument.
C/C PROBATE-Gene G. Hill to 
Ex Parte, 11-18-21.
MD/ROY. DEED-Alvin L. 
Thomas, et al to Alvin Thomas 
Oil Properties LLC, et al, 11-2-
21, See Instrument.
ROW-Caaron Kinnaman to 
Lynn Rector, 5-20-21, See 
Instrument.
MD/ROY. DEED-John Huff, 
et al to Brett G Taylor Royalty 
Trust, 11-8-21, SW/4 Sec. 2, 
Blk. A-2, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey; N/2 Sec. 94, Blk. A-5, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey; 
E/2 of Sections 54 & 57, Blk. 
24, H&GN Ry. Company Sur-
vey. 
MD/ROY. DEED-The Burnett 
Foundation to Kimbell Art 
Foundation, 11-5-21, SW/4 
Sec. 2, Blk. A-2, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey; N/2 Sec. 94, 
Blk. A-5, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey; E/2 of Sections 54 & 
57, Blk. 24, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
MD/ROY. DEED-Kimbell Art 
Foundation to BRD Royalty 
Holdings LLC, 11-5-21, SW/4 
Sec. 2, Blk. A-2, H&GN Ry. 

Company Survey; N/2 Sec. 94, 
Blk. A-5, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey; E/2 of Sections 54 & 
57, Blk. 24, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
MD/ROY. DEED-The Burnett 
Foundation to Kimbell Art 
Foundation, et al, 11-5-21, 
390.8 acs. Sec. 25, Blk. A-3, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
POWER of ATTORNEY-Kim-
bell Art Foundation, et al to 
KRP Isles Management LLC, 
11-5-21, 390.8 acs. Sec. 25, 
Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey.
POWER of ATTORNEY-Nail 
Bay Royalties LLC, et al to 
Taylor Companies Mineral 
Management LLC, 11-8-21, 
SW/4 Sec. 2, Blk. A-2, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey; N/2 
Sec. 94, Blk. A-5, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey; E/2 of Sec-
tions 54 & 57, Blk. 24, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
NOVEMBER 30, 2021
DEED-Miles Neaville to Bon-
nie Christine Neaville, 10-
28-21, All Blk. XX, Romans 
Addition, Shamrock.
DEED-Miles Neaville to Bon-
nie Christine Neaville, 10-28-
21, All Blk. XXXVI, Romans 
Addition, Shamrock, (Except 
Lot 18).
DEED-Miles Neaville to Bon-
nie Christine Neaville, 10-28-
21, All Blk. XXIX, Romans 
Addition, Shamrock.
DECEMBER 1, 2021
DT-Jacob Andrew Widener 
et ux to Wells Fargo Bank 
NA, 11-23-21, Pt. SE/4 Sec. 
60, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey, Sub-Division #4, 
Wheeler.
RDT-F&M Bank to JBK of 
Texas Enterprises LLC, 11-1-
21, All Lots 1 and 2, Blk. 28, 
Original Town, Wheeler (Ex-
cept West 12” of Lot 2).
MD-Nena Barber-Rupp to 
Jack & Arlene Scheller Trust 

(Continued Page 5)
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The Fort Elliott Courgars traveled to Holy Cross on Nov. 30 
and came home with a win! 

Cougar, Jaytin Dickey, scores against the Holy Cross Mustangs.

Fort Elliott’s Cutter Barr makes a lay-up which helped the 
Cougars win against Holy Cross 64-40.

Fort Elliott’s Boone Begert blocks the shot of a Booker Kiowa in 
their game during the Miami Tournament on December 4, 2021.

Kelton Lions hosted their 
first high school home games 
on Friday night. The boys 
faced off against the excellent 
team from Accelerated Chris-
tian but despite taking good 
shots, the boys could not get 
them to fall.
The girls played Darrouzett 
and won the hard fought battle 
by two points.

Chat            (from Page 1) 

Court          (from Page 4) Chat            (from Page 1) 

ship Rodeo. Good Luck.
— cwe —

Be sure to bring the young-
sters in for their visit with San-
ta Saturday.

— cwe —
Good to see the prospect 

of industry coming into the 
county. This will mean em-
ployment opportunities.

— cwe —
Ronal Wayne, Juanita and 

Ian came to OKC Friday eve-
ning to join us at Quail Creek 
Bank’s Snow Tubing. It was 
held at the ballpark down-
town. The slide down was 
great fun; it was just a little bit 
hard climbing back up.

— cwe —
This was an outdoor event 

and we were a bit concerned 
as to how cold it was going to 
be. But, the weather was per-
fect.

— cwe —
William also joined us at the 

event and stayed for some 
cards.

— cwe —
Yes, Pop forgot Stormie’s 

Birthday. It was Saturday; Our 
little colunmnist is 18. Happy 
Birthday, Stormie!

(Continued Page 6)

11-15-21, All Interest in Sec. 
20, Blk. R.E., Roberts & Eddle-
man Survey.
DECEMBER 2, 2021
STATE TAX LIEN-State of 
Texas to Paisan Logistics LLC, 
11-18-21.
ASSIGN./BILL of SALE-High 
Alpine Production LLC to Am-
icus Energy LLC, 11-1-21, See 
Instrument.
ASSIGN./BILL of SALE-Kean 
Production LP to Amicus En-
ergy LLC, 11-1-21, See Instru-
ment.
ASSIGN./BILL of SALE-Them-
istocles Inc. to Amicus Energy 
LLC, 11-1-21, See Instrument.
CEMETERY DEED-Wheeler 
Cemetery Assoc. to Ladona 
Honeycutt, 12-2-21, Lot 1, Blk. 
O-1, NE Addition, Wheeler 
Cemetery, Spaces E 1 & 2.
RDT-Great Plains National 
Bank to Brian Neil Austin, et al, 
11-4-21, 644.4 Acs. Sec. 39, 
Blk. 13, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey.
RDT-Great Plains National 
Bank to Brian Neil Austin, et al, 
11-4-21, 644.4 acs. Sec. 39, 
Blk. 13, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey.

DVL-Brian Austin, et ux to 
Panhandle Fire Land & Cattle 
LLC, 11-12-21, 644.4 acs. 
Sec. 39, Blk. 13, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey.
DT-Panhandle Fire Land & 
Cattle LLC, et al to Capital 
Farm Credit ACA, 11-12-21, 
644.4 acs. Sec. 39, Blk. 13, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey.
DEED-Shamrock Economic 
Development Corp. to City 
of Shamrock, 11-24-21, 5.29 
acs. Sec. 44, Blk. 17, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey, See 
Instrument for complete Land 
Description.
DEED-Loney Wilson, et ux 

to Adeniran Adekoya, 12-1-
21, 2 acs & 2.5 acs. Sec. 65, 
Blk. A-5, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey.
DECEMBER 3, 2021
DVL-Ida Mae Goad (Estate) to 
Kristyn L. Robinson, 12-1-21, 
75’ x 140’ in Blk. 57, Stanley 
Addition, Wheeler.
DT-Kristyn L. Robinson to Am-
erisave Mortgage Corporation, 
12-1-21, 75’ x 140’ in Blk. 57, 
Stanley Addition, Wheeler.
RDT-Quicken Loans Inc. to 
Steven Bentley, et ux, 11-
17-21, All Blk. LI and All Lot 
4, Blk. LII, Romans Addition, 
Shamrock.
District Clerk’s Filings:
#14157-Wheeler County vs 
Berny Byren, Ellen Byrens, 
Bambi Byrens and Barry By-
rens, 10-27-21, Tax Delin-
quency.
#14158-JP Morgan Chase 
Bank N.A. vs Erminio R. Neva-
rez, 10-27-21, Debt/Contract 
Consumer/Commercial Debt.
#14159-The State of Texas vs 
David Anderson Frederic, 10-
28-21, Judgment NISI.
#14160-Ashli N. Cubitt vs 
Dustin L Cubitt, 10-28-21, 
Divorce.
#14161-Ex Parte vs Expunc-
tion, 11-4-21, Expunction.
#14162-Richard Paul Oswalt 
III and Brett Martin Goad vs 
Jason Ray Bliss, 11-11-21, 
Motor Vehicle Accident.
#14163-Discover Bank vs 
David Rion, 11-11-21, Debt/
Contract Consumer/Commer-
cial Debt.

and I met Addy, a twenty-one 
year old Sea Lion. She was 
funny and sweet and very 
smart. I fed Addy fish. I did 
not know that Sea Lions have 
tiny black teeth. I’m glad I got 
to do that. 

I went to the Herpetarium, 
which was interesting. I abso-
lutely hate snakes, but when 
they are behind the glass I 
like to see them. They had 
venomous snakes like the 
Mamba and some harmless 
snakes. I don’t want to touch 
any snake, ever!

After the zoo, we went to 
Red Lobster. I didn’t get to go 
shopping until Sunday after-
noon.

This is a busy week. Our 
Christmas Band Concert will 
be Thursday at 7:00 p.m. in 
the Game Gym. There is a 
BB Tounament at WT High 
School Dec 9-11 and The 
Wheeler Swine Jackpot is 
Saturday. Good Luck Mus-
tangs!

On Sunday, December 
12, Mrs. Lohberger’s stu-
dents will be performing at 
the Mobeetie Visitors Center 
at the Community Christmas 
Celebration. I hope to see you 
there! That’s it!

——————————

As you get older, you’ll 
realize:
• A Ford will also drive you as 
far as a Bentley
• True happiness is not found 
in materialistic things, it comes 
from the love and laughter 
found with each othe.
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Holiday
Open House

You are invited
to the

December 10, 2021

10:00am - 2:00pm

SNACKS  •  DRINKS  •  GIVEAWAYS

405 ALAN L. BEAN BLVD
WHEELER, TEXAS 79096

richardhefley.com • cbcamarillo.com
landsoftexas.com

McLean.

New To Market: 7 miles NE of McLean. 
160+/- acres of recreational property that 
can provide grazing and hunting income.
The property has a permanently installed 
30’ travel trailer with city water under a steel 
shed. Excellent steel cattle working pens 
and barn. Good fences. The grasses in good 
condition and has not been overgrazed. Two 
stocked ponds that never go dry. 2 RV sites. 
Property is secluded with excellent access. 
Wild life feeders are filled year round. Deer, 
Turkeys, Hogs, Quail, Dove.
640+/- acres 9 miles NE of Wheeler: Prop-
erty has been in the same family for over 
65 years. This property has a good stand of 
native grass and has not been overgrazed. 
Excellent hunting opportunities. Deer, Tur-
key, Quail, Dove. Two windmills. Secluded 
but has excellent access. This property 
would be a great addition to any ranching 
or hunting enterprise.
Please view my websits for property details, 
photos and video.

Under Contract

Wheeler County Livestock 
Producers Reminded to Re-
port Forage Losses by Jan. 
30

Coverage Available for Eli-
gible Grazing Losses Due to 
Drought

WHEELER, Texas, De-
cember 6, 2021 — Wheeler 
County U.S. Department of 
Agriculture (USDA) Farm Ser-
vice Agency (FSA) Program 
Technician in Charge Janee 
Cross reminds livestock pro-
ducers who suffered grazing 
losses that occurred through-
out 2021 due to drought to re-
port their losses timely and to 
enroll in the Livestock Forage 
Disaster Program (LFP) by 
Jan. 30, 2021.

LFP provides compensa-
tion to eligible livestock pro-
ducers who suffered grazing 
losses for covered livestock 
due to drought on privately-
owned or cash-leased land 
or fire on federally-managed 

land. Producers in Wheeler 
County are eligible to ap-
ply for 2021 LFP benefits on 
small grain, native pasture, 
and improved pasture.  Live-
stock producers are encour-
aged to contact the Wheeler 
County FSA Office with any 
questions regarding specific 
forage crops that are eligible.

“Prolonged drought condi-
tions have created a need for 
livestock disaster assistance 
programs in Wheeler Coun-
ty,” said Cross. “I encourage 
all affected livestock produc-
ers to contact the Wheeler 
County FSA Office to sched-
ule an appointment to enroll 
in the program before the 
Jan. 30 deadline.”

Livestock producers must 
complete the LFP applica-
tion and required supporting 
documentation no later than 
Jan. 30, 2021, for losses that 
occurred throughout 2021. 
Producers who already have 

appointments scheduled re-
quire no additional action to 
meet the deadline.

Eligible livestock includes 
alpacas, beef cattle, buffalo, 
beefalo, dairy cattle, deer, 
elk, emus, equine, goats, lla-
mas, poultry, reindeer, sheep 
or swine that have been or 
would have been grazing the 
eligible grazing land or pas-
tureland.

Visit www.usda.gov/disas-
ter to learn more about FSA 
disaster assistance programs 
or contact the Wheeler Coun-
ty FSA Office at 806-826-
5578. To find a local FSA of-
fice, visit http://offices.usda.
gov.

In a continuing effort to bet-
ter serve the public, USDA 
has partnered with the Fed-
eral Emergency Management 
Agency and other disaster-
focused organizations to de-
velop the central resource 
for disaster related materials. 

This knowledgebase is a col-
lection of disaster-related re-
sources that are powered by 
agents with subject-matter 
expertise. Visit the USDA Di-
saster Resource Center web-
site to find additional USDA 
disaster information and as-
sistance.

A Reminder For County Livestock Producers 

#14164- Discover Bank vs 
Brad A. Lewis, 11-15-21, Debt/
Contract Consumer/Commer-
cial Debt.
#14165-The State of Texas 
vs Estaban Guerrero Espino, 
$3,195.00, 11-16-21, Civil 
Cases Relating to Criminal 
Matters.
#14166-The State of Texas vs 
2008 Chevrolet Tahoe, Esta-
ban Guerrero Espino, South-
west Auto Sales,11-16-21, 
Civil Cases Relating to Crimi-
nal Matters. 
#14167-The State of Texas 
vs 2007 Ford Expedtion, Jose 
Luis Leon Gonzalez, 11-16-21, 

Civil Cases Relating to Crimi-
nal Matters.
#14168-The State of Texas 
vs $4,756.00 United States 
Currency, Pablo Saul Deleon 
Molina,11-17-21, Civil Cases 
Relating to Criminal Matters.
#14169-The State of Texas vs 
2001 Dodge Grand Caravan, 
Pablo Saul Deleon Molina and 
Robert Allan Ryan,11-17-21, 
Civil Cases Relating to Crimi-
nal Matters.
#14170-The State of Tex-
as vs 2011 Ford Expedition, 
Luis Enrique Montoya Mejia, 
Southwest Auto Sales, 11-17-
21, Civil Cases Relating to 
Criminal Matters.
#14171-The State of Texas 
vs $23,181.00, Renaldo Or-
tiz Jimenez, 11-18-21, Civil 
Cases Relating to Criminal 
Matters.
#14172-Wheeler County vs 
Oryan Oil & Gas, 11-19-21, 
Tax Delinquency
#14173-The State of Texas vs 
$9,157.00, Freddy Ruiz, 11-
19-21, Civil Cases Relating to 

Criminal Matters.
#14174-The State of Texas 
vs 2011 Honda Odyssey, 
Santiago Lopez-Corona, 11-
19-21, Civil Cases Relating to 
Criminal Matters.
#14175-The State of Texas vs 
$7,829.00, Santiago Lopez-
Corona, 11-19-21, Civil Cases 
Relating to Criminal Matters.
#14176-The State of Texas 
vs $7,142.00, Patrick Doug-
las Johnson, 11-19-21, Civil 
Cases Relating to Criminal 
Matters.
#14177-The State of Texas 
vs $5,013.00, Alexis Morales 
and Hector Roblero, 11-19-21, 
Civil Cases Relating to Crimi-
nal Matters.
#14178-The State of Texas vs 
$1,679.00, Gregory Maxwell, 
11-19-21, Civil Cases Relating 
to Criminal Matters.
#14179-The State of Texas 
vs 2010 Volkswagen Routan, 
Gregory Maxwell and Sam-
path Sengbounpheng, 11-19-
21, Civil Cases Relating to 
Criminal Matters.

Court          (from Page 5) 


