
Fire Destroys
Rural School

The San Jacinto School build­
ing in northwestern Briscoe 
County was destroyed by fire 
Sunday afternoon. Fire broke out 
in the teacherage, and spread to 
the cedar shingle roof of the 
school building before the fire 
departments from Silverton and 
Tulia arrived on the scene.

One Silverton fireman said. “I 
think we might have saved the 
school building if we could have 
gotten there ten minutes sooner.”

The Milo School District and 
Beverly School District, both or­
ganized in the 1800’s, were con­
solidated into the San Jacinto 
School District in the late 1920’s. 
The red brick building had two 
classrooms which were separat­
ed by folding doors.

The San Jacinto School District 
was annexed into the Silverton 
Independent School District in 
1968, and later the school build­
ing was designated as a commun­
ity center.

Webb Services 
Held At Tulsa

Funeral services for Paul H. 
Webb, 78, were conducted at 
2:00 p.m. Monday at Wallace Fu­
neral Chapel in Tulia with Rev. 
Frank Terry, pastor of First Uni­
ted Methodist Church, officiat­
ing.

Burial was in Rose Hill Ceme­
tery, with Wallace Funeral Home 
in charge of arrangements.

Mr. Webb, a long-time resident 
of Tulia and former Silverton 
resident, died at 12:05 a.m. Sat­
urday at Swisher Memorial Hos­
pital.

Born July 7, 1903 in Bella 
County, he married Lura Mae 
Hindley August 23, 1923 in Lake 
Creek. Mrs. Webb died February 
13, 1972.

Mr. Webb moved to Tulia in 
1942 from Silverton and was a 
retired salesman for the Dr. Pep­
per Company. He had been active 
in the Tulia Fire Department.

Survivors include two daught­
ers, Mrs. Bess McWilliams of 
Silverton and Mrs. Bob (Jo) 
Trout of Mesquite; three sons, 
E. J. Webb of Borger, Paul How­
ard Webb of Tulia and Billy 
Webb of Pearland; one sister, 
Opel Webb of Cooper; 10 grand­
children and eight great-grand­
children.

Pallbearers were Jerry McWil­
liams, Larry McWilliams, Paul 
McWilliams, Lee Trout, Typ 
Webb, Kerry Webb, Cliff Steven, 
Steve Berryman and Basil Hoff­
man.

EASTER GREETINGS
Marcella Brown would like to 

wish all her many Silverton 
friends a very happy Easter. She 
is doing well in the home of 
James and Martha, with excel­
lent nursing care, and appre­
ciates all the cards, letters and 
remembrances she receives from 
Silverton.

Marcella Brown
Box 358
Gilmer, Texas 75644

Mrs, Brown Passes 
State Board Exam

Mrs. Sally Northcutt Brown 
graduated from Jessie Lee’s Hair 
Institute in Lubbock March 23 
with a 95 average for the nine 
months. She also won a trophy.

Mrs. Brown took her state 
board exam in Austin April 2, 
and will be taking appointments 
at The Mademoiselle in Lubbock, 
located at 50th and University, 
starting this week.

She was accompanied to Aus­
tin by her mother and sister, 
Mrs. Larry Jarrett and Miss Judy 
Northcutt. Judy was her sister’s 
model:

Arnold Morris of Grand Prair­
ie has been here visiting his 
mother, Mrs. Vivian Morris. His 
father, Roy Morris, is now receiv­
ing treatment at a hospital in 
Vernon.

Mrs. Grace Hutsell arrived 
here Friday from Reseda, Cali­
fornia to attend the funeral of 
R. L. O. (Rags) Riddell. She re­
turned to Lubbock Friday even­
ing with Mr. and Mrs. Terry 
Grimland and family. Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Weast and family join­
ed them at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronny Vaughan and Justin 
and Ellen Hutsell.

Silverton: Home of Scenic Lake Mackenzie
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liram tats Re-Elected In
Light Voter Turnout

Incumbents John Schott and 
Perry Brunson were re-elected to 
their seats on the board of trus­
tees of the Silverton Independent 
School District with 68 votes in 
light voter turnout last Saturday.

No other candidates were list­
ed on the school ballot.

Incumbents David Tipton and

Donnie Martin were re-elected to 
the Silverton city council with 
votes of 56 and 54 respectively. 
John Bowman polled 43 votes to 
be elected to fill the vacancy 
created by the death of Council­
man Ted Strange. The other can­
didate, Mrs. Helen Strange, pol­
led 39 votes.

Little Dribbler Tournament 
Opens Monday Afternoon

The Silverton Little Dribblers 
Tournament will be played April 
12-13-15-16-17. The games will be­
gin at 4:00 o’clock every day ex­
cept Saturday. They will begin 
at 9:00 a.m. on Saturday. Teams 
from Valley, Kress, Tulia and 
Silverton will participate.

Admission will be $1.00 for 
adults and 50c for students. All 
the proceeds from the tourna­
ment will be used locally. Indi­
vidual trophies will be awarded 
for first, second, third and con­
solation.

To have a tournament of this 
size, a lot of help is needed from 
the parents. Following is a list 
of people who are being asked to 
bring something and/or work. If 
you, for some reason, cannot 
work when you are scheduled to, 
please contact the person in 
charge of that committee or get 
someone to take your place.

MONDAY, APRIL 12 
4:00- 7:00: Janice Hill, Books

LaJuan Eddleman, Clock 
7:00- 9:00: Judy Miller, Books 

Glenda Couch, Clock 
TUESDAY, APRIL 13 

4:00- 7:00: Kathy Frizzell, Books 
Waynelle Couch, Clock

7:00- 9:00: Kathy Frizzell, Books 
LaQuetta Schott, Clock 

THURSDAY, APRIL 15
4:00- 7:00: Sandi Tomlin, Books 

Kathy Hubbard, Clock 
7:00-10:00: Shirley Henderson,

Books
Waynelle Couch, Clock 

FRIDAY, APRIL 16
4:00- 7:00: Veneta Chappell,

Books
Shirley Henderson, Clock 

7:00-10:00: Waynelle Couch,
Books

Dwight Ramsey, Clock 
SATURDAY, APRIL 17

9:00-11:00: Kathy Frizzell, Books 
Waynelle Couch, Clock 

11:00- 2:00: Rhenda Burson,
Books

Pat Edwards, Clock 
2:00- 5:00: Amy Perkins, Books 

Waynelle Couch, Clock 
5:00- 8:00: Brenda Patton, Books 

Connie Smith, Clock 
If you cannot work contact 

Waynelle Couch.
GATE WORKERS 

MONDAY, APRIL 12 
4:00- 6:00: Rita Davis

See LITTLE DRIBBLER 
CONTINUED ON PAGE TWO

Laüd la y  Bn Taxed On
Agricultural Use Value

Is the land you own being 
used for agricultural purposes? 
If it is, then you may be eligible 
for tax relief on that property.

According to Mrs. Carlye Hill, 
chief appraiser for the Briscoe 
County Appraisal District, quali­
fied landowners have the option 
of applying for agricultural or 
open-space land valuation on 
their property.

She said that two constitution­
al amendments provide for the 
taxation of land on its agricul­
tural use (or productivity) value. 
In other words, taxes would be 
assessed against, the productivity 
value of the land instead of what 
the property would sell for in 
the open market.

Mrs. Hill indicated that the le­
gal basis for this valuation is 
found in the Texas Constitution, 
Art. VIII, Sec. 1-d. She added 
that several criteria must be met 
in order to qualify under this sec­
tion. Some include:

—The land must be owned by 
a natural person (does not in­
clude corporations, partnerships, 
agencies or organizations);

—The land must have been de­
voted exclusively to agricultural 
use for at least three years prior 
to the year application is first 
made;

—Annual application is requir­
ed of the owner;

— Owner must file a sworn 
statement each year he applies, 
attesting to the land’s agricul­
tural use;

—The chief appraiser must de­
termine that the landowner qual­
ifies and must approve the ap­
plication, and,

Amarillo Stock 
Show Being 
Discounfinued

In a meeting held last week, 
the executive committee of the 
Amarillo Tri State Fair decided 
to discontinue sponsorship of the 
Amarillo Stock Show, effective 
immediately, in order to devote 
more time and effort toward an 
expanded Tri State Fair in 1983, 
according to Earnest Kiker, Bris­
coe County Extension Agent.

The 1983 fair will be extended 
to cover eight days, rather than 
six days, and more emphasis will 
be placed on junior animals, say 
fair officials.

New departments for juniors 
to be added to the fair will in­
clude a steer show, a beef heifer 
show and a livestock judging 
contest. Shows for lambs, bar- 
rows, capons and rabbits will be 
continued and expanded for jun­
ior exhibitors. As in the past, 
juniors eligible for the fair will 
be those originating from the 35 
counties of the High Plains area.

Residen Homestead Exemptions

Davidson Purchases 
Stock Of j
Silverton Gin j

Jim Davidson purchased the 
stock of Silverton Gin, Inc., an<j 
became its principal shareholder 
on March 19. j

The former stockholders were 
Don Burson, Iris Burson, Bettji 
Kirk, George Long, Charles 
Whitfill, Ben Whitfill, Jane Self 
and G. W. Lee. i

Davidson has been manager of 
the gin for several years.

1 4  He has announced plans t<j>
__ continue to operate as Silverton

Gin. i
I

Silverton FFA To
Can Reduce Tax BurdenHave VB

Under Section 1-d-l valuation, a 
change in the use of the land 
triggers a rollback tax. The 
change of use would be to a non- 
agricultural purpose that would 
not qualify for productivity val­
uation.

The additional tax is measured 
by the difference between the 
taxes paid under productivity 
valuation provisions and the tax­
es which would have been paid 
at the market value, she added. 
The re-capture of lost taxes ex­
tends back three years under 
Section 1-d and five years under 
Section 1-d-l.

Additional information is av­
ailable at the local appraisal dis­
trict office. Personnel there will 
be able to assist with the data 
which will be necessary for de­
termining qualifications for the 
program.

Application forms are avail­
able at the appraisal district of­
fice and should be filed after 
January 1 and before May 1 for 
the tax year.

The Briscoe County Appraisal 
Office is open from 8:00 a.m. un-

Tax relief for property tax 
purposes is available to Texas 
homeowners.

Mrs. Carlye Hill, chief apprais­
er for the Briscoe County Ap­
praisal District, announced the 
availability of several residence 
homestead exemptions which can 
reduce the tax burden for home- 
owners who qualify. Beginning 
in 1982, a one-time application is 
required, and homesteads must 
meet the following qualifica­
tions:

*As of January 1, 1982, the 
home must be owned by the per­
son claiming the exemption;

*The home must be designed 
or adapted for human residence;

*The home must actually be 
used as a residence; and

*The home must be occupied 
as the principal residence of an 
owner who qualified for the ex­
emption.

A residence homestead is a
structure, together with the land 
and improvements, which are 
used for residential purposes.

Mobile homes, if they meet the 
qualifications, can be claimed as 
homesteads even if they are on 
leased land.

“A taxpayer can still qualify 
for the exemptions even if a por­
tion of his residence is used for 
other purposes, such as a busi­
ness in the home,” Mrs. Hill said. 
“Additionally, a homeowner will 
not lose the exemption if he tem­
porarily moves away, provided 
that he intends to return and 
does not claim a homestead else­
where.”

Various types of homestead ex­
emptions exist. Applications for 
any must be filed with the chief 
appraiser after January 1 and 
before May 1.

School districts grant a $5,000 
general homestead exemption to 
all qualified homeowners. A

til 5:00 p.m. It is located in the 
southwest corner of the court­
house basement. The office tele­

phone number is 823-2161.

$10,000 school homestead exemp­
tion is offered to citizens 65 
years or older and to disabled 
persons.

An advantage associated with 
the over-65 exemption is that 

. senior citizens receive a “ tax 
freeze or tax ceiling” on the 
school taxes they are assessed in 
the first year of qualification. Al­
though the appraised value of 
their homesteads are free to fluc­
tuate with the market, the school 
taxes will not increase.

An exception to this would be 
the addition of an improvement, 
excluding repairs or general 
maintenance. In that case, the 
value of the new improvement 
would be taxed at the current 
rate and added to the previous 
tax ceiling to create a new ceil­
ing.

For more information, home- 
owners should contact Briscoe 
County Appraisal District in the 
southwest corner of the base­
ment in the courthouse. The of­
fice phone is 823-2161.

NEW ARRIVALI
Mr. and Mrs. John Edwards of 

Canyon are parents of a son, 
Jonathan Mac, born at 5:40 a.m. 
Tuesday, April 6, at Northwest 
Texas Hospital in Amarillo. He 
weighed six pounds and fourteen 
ounces, and measured 19 inches 
long.

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
John Edwards of New Home and 
Mr and Mrs Roy Mack Walker of 
Silverton.

Great-grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. J. W. Edwards and Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarence Eads all of 
New Home; Mrs. Blanche New­
man and Mrs. Hassie Arnold, 
both of Silverton.

Mrs. Charles Grantham has 
been a patient at Central Plains 
Hospital in Plainview. Doctors 
have been keeping her under 
observation while they change 
and regulate her medication. !

Silverton FFA will sponsor a 
Volleyball Tournament April 20- 
22-23-24. Entry deadline is Fri­
day, April 16.

There will be divisions for 
women’s, men’s and mixed teams, 
with the entry fee being $18.00 
per team. Entry fee must be pai<jl 
before team participates in the 
tournament, and team memberk 
must pay gate admission. The 
admission fee is $1.00 for adults, 
75c for students, and those se­
ven and under will be admitted 
free. ;

Ten minute games will be 
played until the finals. The ros­
ters will be limited to 10 playerk, 
and seven first-place individual 
trophies will be awarded the 
champions in each bracket.

To enter call Silverton FFAi, 
(day) 806-823-2476 or (night) 806- 
847-2585.

Women’s division games are to 
begin at 6:00 p.m. Tuesday, Aprijl 
20. Men’s division games begin alt 
6:00 p.m. on Thursday, April 2% 
Mixed team play starts at 6:00 
p.m. Friday, April 23. Finals ih
all divisions begin at 6:00 p.mji.
Saturday, April 24. ;

YOUNG FARMERS 
TO MEET TONIGHT

Silverton Young Farmers will 
meet at 8:00 p.m. today (Thurs­
day) in the school ag building.

Service & Supply will present 
a program on fencing.

The public is,invited.

JOINING PRINCESS CRUISES
Ricky Hutsell left for Los An­

geles, California on Wednesday, 
March 31. He is joining Princess 
Cruises for a year to work on the 
Sun Princess. The ship is pres­
ently in San Juan and goes to 
Mexico.

In May the ship returns to 
Los Angeles via the Panama Can­
al enroute to its run between 
Canada and Alaska.

Hutsell visited his parents, 
Riddell and Grace Hutsell, and 
brothers, Wayne and Elliott, in

\Reseda, California.

—The agricultural business 
conducted on the land must be 
the owner’s primary occupation 
and source of income.

Mrs. Hill said another form of 
alternate valuation available to 
qualified landowners is that of 
open-space land valuation. Effec­
tive since 1979, it provides for 
the valuation of agricultural and 
timberlands and ecological lab­
oratories. She added that the le­
gal basis for this form of land 
valuation is in the Texas Con­
stitution, Art. VIII, Sec. 1-d-l.

Several conditions must be met 
in order to qualify under this 
section, including:

—The land must have been 
devoted principally to agricultur­
al use for at least five of the last 
seven years;

—The land must be involved 
in a qualifying agricultural use.

—The land must be used for 
agricultural purposes to the de­
gree of intensity generally ac­
cepted in the area, and,

—The chief appraiser must ap­
prove the application.

In 1982, once an application 
for 1-d-l open-space valuation is 
filed with the chief appraiser 
and approved, a landowner will 
not be required to submit anoth­
er application so long as the land 
qualifies. The chief appraiser, 
however, may request that a new 
application be filed.

Mrs. Hill said that under either 
form of valuation, the possibility 
of a rollback tax exists. She indi­
cated this liability for additional 
tax is triggered under Section 1-d 
valuation by either the sale or 
change in the use of the land.
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Calvin and Elsie on the bluff 
which overlooks the theatre 
where the musical drama "Tex­

as" plays. The 1000-foot drop be­
neath their feet makes the back­
drop behind the stage. Perfor­

mances are mid-June through 
late August. For tickets and in­
formation you may write "Tex-

as," Box 268, Canyon, Texas 
79015. Bill Rhew Photo
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Doyce Middlebrook is a 39-year old fifth generation farmer and 
lifelong resident of Lubbock Co. and District 84. He has farming 
and ranching interest in Lamb Co. and Deaf Smith Co. as 
w el as Lubbock Co.

He graduated from Texas Tech with a BA in Government.

Doyce and wife Paula are natives of Shallowater as are their 
children Randy, 20, and Patti, 14. After attending West Texas 
State University at Canyon, Randy is now engaged in farming 
and fattening feeder calves. Patti is a freshman at Shallowater 
High School and active in the National Honor Society, track and 
fine arts.

All family members are active in the Shallowater United Metho­
dist Church where Doyce and Paula have been Sunday School 
teachers for youth and adult classes. Doyce also has served as 
Layleader, Youth Leader, Finance Chairman, and is presently 
Crusade Chairman for the Retired Ministers Pension Fund.

Doyce also: Has served as Board President of Shallowater Co- 
Op Gin for the past 14 years and as Board Member for 17 years; 
is a director of the First State Bank of Shallowater; Board Vice 
President and Executive Committee Member of Plains Cotton 
Co-Op Assn.; Board Member of American Cotton Growers since 
its formation for five gin districts; Member of Plains Cotton 
Growers, Inc.; Member of the Grain Sorghum Producers Assn.; 
Member of the American Quarter Horse Assn.; and serves as 
Alternate Director of Cotton Incorporated.

He is interested in conservation and development of water, soil 
and other natural resources in the state; has represented PCCA 
and ACG in Washington, DC affairs dealing with regulations 
affecting cotton marketing; and raises and trains registered 
quarter horses for competition and pleasure.

M iM e M  For District 84
This adv. paid for by Doyce Middlebrook for State 
Representative, Doyce Middlebrook Treasurer

6:00- 9:00: I i ird
TUESDA' *R!L 13

4:00- 6:00: Ar' Ramsey 
6:00- 9:00: Ms >iv Bridges 

THURSDAY, APRIL 15 
4:00- 6:00: Lee O’Neal 
6:00- 8:00: Berniece Stubble­

field
8:00-10:00: Gail Arnold 

FRIDAY, APRIL 16
4:00- 6:00: Latresa Minyard 
6:00- 8:00: Peggy Miller 
8:00-10:00: Odelia Stidham 

SATURDAY, APRIL 17 
9:00-11:00: Pat McWaters 

11:00- 1:00: Linda Minyard 
1:00- 3:00: Tommie Blackerby 
3:00- 5:00: Barbara Pigg 
5:00- 8:00: Judy Miller 
If you cannot work at your 

scheduled time, contact Ann 
West. ^ f l !

CONCESSION STAND 
WORKERS

MONDAY, APRIL 12
Tina Nance, Chairman 

4:00- 6:30: Sue Breedlove 
Pat Lavy 
Anita Ramsey 

6:30- 9:00: Cathey Weaks
Lynda Fogerson 
Marilyn Bridges 

TUESDAY, APRIL 13 
Carolyn Lowrey, Chairman 

4:00- 6:30: Kathy Hubbard 
Linda Baird 
Rhenda Burson 

6:30- 9:00: Judy Miller
Linda Minyard 
Freda Edmonds 

THURSDAY, APRIL 15 
Mary Lane Younger, Chairman 
4:00- 7:00: Veneta Chappell 

Mary Asebedo 
Glenda Couch 

7:00-10:00: Peggy Rowell 
Brenda Patton 
Olga Garcia 

FRIDAY, APRIL 16 N 
Carolyn Lowrey, Chairman 

4:00- 7:00: Lee O’Neal 
Gail Arnold 
Fay Perkins

7:00-10:00: LaQuetta Schott ■ 
Pat McWaters 
Barbara Pigg 

SATURDAY, APRIL 17
Fay Perkins, Chairman 

9:00-12:00: Carolyn Lowrey 
Connie Smith

Began Wednesday, April 7 - -10 :0 0  a.m, 

¡m m f All Children's and Junior

Wear and Accessories 

Will Be On Sale

GREATEST SALE OF TH E YEA R
Includes Hew Spring 

and Summer Merchandise

Does Hoi Include 
Any infant or Maternity Wear

or Accessories
Cash, VISA or MasterCharge Only

Ail Sales Fins! Ho Exceptions

T H E  F A S H I O N  S H A C K
117 East Ire s  'way Tulia, T§

Katrice Minyard 
12:00- 3:00: Mary Lane Younger 

Judy Miller 
Angie Lowrey 

Von Ann Mercer, Chairman 
3:00- 6:00: Tina Nance

Shavonne Lowrey 
Berniece Stubblefield 

6:00- 8:00: Carolyn Lowrey 
Janice Hill 
Donna Tomlin

Following is a list of people 
who are asked to bring one doz­
en brownies cut in three-inch
squares or one dozen Rice Kris- 
pies bars in three-inch squares: 
Carolyn Lowrey is chairman of 
this committee.

MONDAY, APRIL 12 
Brownies Rice Krispies
LaJuan Eddleman Judy Miller
Rita Davis Linda Baird
Pat Lavy Sue Breedlove
Anita Ramsey Cathey Weaks

TUESDAY, APRIL 13 
Brownies Rice Krispies
Kathy Frizzell Marilyn Bridges 
Lynda Fogerson Kathy Hubbard 
Rhenda Burson Linda Minyard 
Pat Edwards Carolyn Lowrey 

THURSDAY, APRIL 15 
Brownies Rice Krispies
Veneta Chappell Gloria Wood
Waynelle Couch Sandi Tomlin
Mary Asebedo Peggy Rowell
Glenda Couch Olga Garcia
Lee O’Neal Shirley Henderson 

FRIDAY, APRIL 16 
Brownies Rice Krispies
Odelia Stidham Peggy Miller
Gail Arnold Latresa Minyard 
Virginia Clardy Mary Myers
Marsha Brunson Connie Patino 

SATURDAY, APRIL 17 
Brownies Rice Krispies
Connie Smith Janice Hill
Tina Nance Tommie Blackerby 
Berniece Stubblefield Ann West 
Von Ann Mercer Fay Perkins 
Brenda Patton LaQuetta Schott 
Mary L. Younger Barbara Pigg 
Freda Edmonds Pat McWaters 

Marsha Brunson will be res­
ponsible for keeping the dressing 
rooms locked. She may be noti­
fying some of you to help her.

Ray Thompson Implement Co.
Silverton, Texas

/  *»M£TY mST TIES

SUNSENSOR 
SUNGLASSES

OPEN ALL DAY EASTER

r
ASSORTED FLAVORS

ALLSUP'S 
ICE CREAM

CONVENIENCE STORES

THERE'S ONE NEAR YOU'
' ■ M l

Ear!'/ Harvest Peas lf o r $ U 9
PRICES EFFECTIVE APRIL 8-10.1982 

1 WHILE SUPPLIES LAST



Roberson - Long Vows Exchanged
In Formal Church Ceremony

Melissa Roberson and Nick 
Long, both of Plainview, were 
united in marriage at the First 
Presbyterian Church in Plainview 
on Saturday, April 3, at 4:00 p.m. 
Performing the double-ring cere­
mony was Dr. Charles Teykl, pas­
tor of the church.

Parents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. B. O. Roberson of Has­
kell and Mr. and Mrs. George 
Long of Silverton.

A prelude of traditional wed­
ding music was presented by the 
organist, Mrs. Steve Hurt. Edwin 
Roberson of Dallas, brother of 
the bride, sang “The Greatest of 
These is Love” and “Walk in

Love.” Both compositions are by 
Dr. Andy Patterson of Abilene.

Escorted by her father and 
given in marriage by her par­
ents, the bride wore a formal 
white gown of miramist sheer or­
ganza over taffeta, an Alfred An­
gelo Original designed by Mich­
elle. The fitted bodice, fashioned 
with Venice lace, was re-embrod- 
ered with silk floss. The Queen 
Anne neckline was sculptured 
with Venice lace edging sprink­
led with sequins and pearls. The 
long full sleeves, with Venice 
lace insets, were cuffed with 
lace. The A-line tunic type skirt 
had two deep sheer flounce ruf­

fles that swept into a cathedral 
train. Her lace cloche, encircled 
with Venice lace and lace med­
allions and sprinkled with se­
quins and seed pearls, held the 
cathedral length veil of silk illu­
sion. She carried a cascade bou­
quet of white roses, gardenias, 
stephanotis and baby’s breath.

To carry out bridal tradition, 
she wore antique cameos belong­
ing to both her grandmothers. 
Something new was her wedding 
dress. She borrowed a lace hand­
kerchief from her great-aunt, and 
added the symbolic blue garter. 
In her shoe, the bride placed a 
sixpence which was a gift from 
her matron of honor, who had 
bought the coin while tour­
ing London, England.

Mrs. Ricky Scheffel of Lubbock 
was matron of honor. The brides­
maids were Mrs. Donnie Rieger

of Haskell, Mrs. Mike Keliehor of 
Lubbock and Miss Mona Bledsoe 
of Denton. They wore identical 
formal gowns of lilac chiffon ov­
er taffeta featuring a capelet 
bodice. Each carried long-stem­
med bouquets of daffodils, pink 
roses, statice, lilac daisies and 
baby’s breath tied with lilac and 
lace ribbons.

Miss Laura Roberson of Abil­
ene, niece of the bride, and Miss 
Kaki Stapleton of Haskell wore 
identical floor-length white eye­
let pinafore dresses. The dresses 
were trimmed with eyelet ruffles 
and lace insertion with lilac rib­
bon. They carried white baskets 
filled with spring bouquets.

Tyler Sperry of Arlington, ne­
phew of the groom, was the ring 
bearer. He carried a lace-trim­
med white satin pillow.

The best man was Mel Sperry
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of Arie ther-in-law of
the groom The groomsmen were 
Lane Garvin and Tom Burson, 
both of Silverton, and Matt 
Thompson of Memphis.

Guests were seated by Stewart 
Roberson of Abilene, brother of 
the bride, and Jeff Piersol of 
Plainview.

The bride’s mother wore a 
gown of apricot polyester over 
organza. A capelet bodice draped 
over the shoulders to form mid­
arm sleeves. Soft folds of chif­
fon made a cumberbund belt 
fastened with a self-chiffon rosé. 
She wore a gardenia corsage. 
The groom’s mother wore a lilac 
chiffon shirt-waist floor-length 
gown with off-white border print 
skirt. She added an orchid cor­
sage.

A brand new4 id» *m * •*.< a Va f<w, That smart sophisticate*lESjpxackage
Artieri < : o'' $ t )esi » & o 11 i ng die sol fami l y , that gc:i'ye C >rrteg a sec k am the :> c 3 t 3 nd ■ ■
Ava I làfolè on a IC  uiiass Supreme,,, and. . Ioti ring look fnsi de a nd out i % how

b r a k e s , i t  ^

■I : erviilc o rT t»io c ï rre c ìs u rm ìv ;. arici a  • lot c i  - 
§ !; En g prié s^ A  4.3 *iitér'dîe$eri V ô .

v; ,h . r , S ; i 5 c ^ la r $ ^ f l t e t  d ié s e t y p  à n d b > .f

if îirt^ b ô ’traded fot: fie  sc 
t; p value of a styftshCutïass Süprer

Cutlass pera coupé! onci seddns. • 'I available on Olds Omega coupes! ' ; one today.gt /out Oidsdeate
l l l l l i n  iljiiiii'iiiilirïii

MRS. NICK LONG
&  ☆  ☆  ☆  ☆  ☆

A reception honoring the 
couple was held in the Garden 
Room of the First Presbyterian 
Church following the wedding 
ceremony. It was hosted by the 
bride’s parents.

The bride’s table was covered 
with an oval white organza cloth 
with scalloped swags. All ap­
pointments were silver. The 
three-tiered wedding cake was 
decorated with lilac and purple 
flowers. Mixed spring bouquets 
of fresh flowers were also used.

The groom’s table was covered 
with a white quilted floor-length 
cloth with a quilted valance trim. 
Chocolate cake topped with sliv­
ered nuts and coffee were ser­
ved. All appointments were brass 
including pheasants belonging to 
the groom.

Members of the houseparty 
were Mrs. Steve Coulter, Mrs. 
Jerry Wheeler, Peggy Robertson, 
Mrs. Steve Nutt, Mrs. Tom Bur- 
son and Mrs. Lane Garvin.

Mr. and Mrs. George Long, par­
ents of the groom, hosted the re­
hearsal dinner at the Plainview 
Club on April 2.

For traveling, the bride chose 
a navy and fushia suit with navy, 
white and fushia striped top. 
She added a gardenia corsage 
lifted from the bridal bouquet.

Following a trip to New Or­
leans, Louisiana, the couple will 
reside in Plainview. The bride 
attended Hardin - Simmons Uni­
versity in Abilene and was gradu­
ated from Texas Tech with a de­
gree in home economics. She is

employed by the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service. . The 
groom attended Angelo State 
University and graduated from 
East Texas State University with 
a degree in radio and television. 
He is employed by KVOP-KATX 
in Plainview.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Strange of 
Silverton hosted a dinner party 
for the engaged couple at the 
Plainview Club on February 24.

A bridal shower was given in 
the home of Mrs. Merwyn Igo in 
Plainview on February 27.

Mr. and Mrs. E. A. Birdwell 
and Mr. and Mrs. James Davis, 
all of Silverton, hosted a dinner 
party at the Plainview Club for 
the wedding attendants on Sat­
urday evening, February 27.

A coffee and gift shower hon­
oring the bride-elect was held in 
the home of Mrs. Carl Bomar in 
Silverton on March 6.

Mrs. Donnie Rieger and Mrs. 
Ricky Scheffel hosted a pantry 
shower on March 13 in the Rieg­
er home.

Mrs. Jerry Logan of Hale Cen­
ter hosted a paper shower in her 
home for the bride-elect on 
March 14.

A brunch was held on March 
20 at the Haskell Community 
Room.

Parents of the bride-elect host­
ed a barbecue at their home on 
Saturday evening, March 20. At­
tending were the engaged couple, 
the Long family, and the brunch 
hostesses and their families.

STRENGTH X Y IE LD  = PROFIT
AND THAT MEANS HURDT'S 580

BEAT THE DEPRESSION PRICES WITH 
HU ROT'S 580. IF YOU ARE TIRED  
OF MEDIOCRE COTTON . . . PLANT 
THE PREM IER COTTON OF THE WORLD

HURDT'S 580 CHARACTERISTICS:
85,000 BSI or better Pressley 
(25 or better grams per tex)
1 1/32 inch staple or better 
Resistant to Fusarium, Verticillium 
Wilt and Root Knot Nematode 
High yields of 1 to 3 bales per acre 
iMicronaine — 3.5 to 4.0 
Strips Clean

(Texas and Oklahoma)
Picks Clean

(De°p South and Arizona)
Dry land or irrigated 
Gins Good

COTTON MILLS WOULD PREFER TO SPIN IT 
BECAUSE OF 25 OR BETTER GRAMS 
PER TEX

Makes excellent blue jeans and cotton fabrics

AND THE BOTTON LINE . . .  IT PUTS MORE 
MONEY IN YOUR POCKET ! !

806 823-2178 Silverton, Texas
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REGULAR SEASON ENDS 
jFOR LITTLE DRIBBLERS 

March 29
blue 2 4 6 16
Red 2 10 15 23
¡Blue—Bryan Ramsey, 14; Kendal 

Minyard, 2
Red—Kirk Couch, 10; Blake Ed- 

dleman, 7; Edward Moreno, 6 
Red 10 12 18 20
Blue 0 0 6 8
Red—Tara Nance, 10; Wendi 

Stubblefield, 4; Mindy Ar­
nold, 4; Stacy Minyard, 2 

Blue—Carey Blackerby, 5; Venita 
Asebedo, 3

Red * 2 2 4 9
Blue 0 0 4 6
Red—Brad West, 4; Brandon Ed- 

dleman, 3; Jamie Frizzell, 2 
Blue—Robbie McWaters, 4; Clay 

Schott, 2
April 2

Blue 1 11 15 20
White 9 21 29 34
Blue—Rachel Bridges, 12; Tonya 

Baird, 5; Carrie Ann Grabbe, 
3

White—'Lori Stubblefield, 16; 
Traci Tomlin, 14; Penni Fo- 
gerson, 4

Red 12 18 28 38
Green 2 10 14 22
Red—Kirk Couch, 18; Wayne 

Henderson, 12; Blake Eddle- 
man, 8

Green—Clay Mercer, 12; Teddy 
Hubbard, 6; Anthony Min­
yard, 4

Red 4 4 6 13
Green 4 8 10 12
Red—Mindy Arnold, 7; Shannon 

Bingham, 4; Wendi Stubble­
field, 2

Green—DeLyn Patton, 6; Julia 
t Couch, 4; Avonna Miller, 2 
Red 8 10 14 16
Green 1 3  7 9
Red—Brad West, 6; Brandon Ed- 

dleman, 4; Jamie Frizzell, 4; 
Gabe Patino, 2

Green—Mitch Clardy, 6; Will 
Rowell, 2; Neal Edwards, 1 

April 5
White 2 4 8 15
Blue 12 16 18 22
White—Traci Tomlin, 14; Penni 

Fogerson, 1
Blue—Genie Lavy, 14; Lori Stub­

blefield, 6; Carrie Ann Grab­
be, 2

Red 8 14 27 35
Green 4 9 18 21
Red—Edward Moreno, 11; Kirk 

Couch, 8; Wayne Henderson, 
8; Blake Eddleman, 6; Brad­
ley Brunson, 2

Green—Clay Mercer, 9; Teddy 
Hubbard, 7; Anthony Min­
yard, 5

Red 7 11 11 11
Green 3 8 12 16
Red—Tara Nance, 6; Shannon 

Bingham, 4; Wendi Stubble­
field, 1

Green—DeLyn Patton, 8; Julia 
Couch, 5; Stacy Chappell, 3 

Red 0 0 4 6
Green 4 5 5 7
Red—Brad West, 6 
Green—Mitch Clardy, 4; Neal 

Edwards, 3

BIKE-A-THON TO FIGHT 
CHILDHOOD CANCER

The Bike-a-Thon sponsor, L. O. 
A. Junior Study Club, today ask­
ed Silverton residents to partici­
pate in the St. Jude Children’s 
Research Hospital “Wheels-for- 
Life” activity to be held April 
24 (weather permitting).

Riders are needed for the Bike- 
a-Thon to raise funds for the 
world-famous research center 
and its battle against childhood 
cancer and other catastrophic 
childhood diseases.

This year’s ride is being dedi­
cated to Terry, a leukemia pa­
tient at St. Jude. “By riding for 
Terry, we’ll really be helping 
all striken children since re­
search is the only way these ill­
nesses can be conquered,” said 
a spokesman for L. O. A. Junior 
Study Club. “We’re looking for 
people who will contribute some 
of their time and energy to help 
children live. We really need 
bike riders, since they are the 
ones who can make this Bike-a- 
Thon successful.”

In the Bike-a-Thon, riders en­
list sponsors who donate a sum 
for each mile completed. Riders 
who raise $25 will receive a St. 
Jude T-shirt, and those raising 
^74 will receive a jacket. Then 
are also prizes for other riders. 
A special prize will be given to 
the rider who completes the most 
mileage, and another special 
prize awaits the rider collecting 
the most money.

Sponsor forms are available at 
the Silverton School office, Nan­
ces, and Caprock Food.

“You can put your muscles to 
work for a child’s life in this 
Bike-a-Thon,” said Mrs. Patsy 
Towe. chairman of the event. 
“We need every bike and every 
rider.”

Interested persons can contact 
Mrs. Towe at 823-2482.

St. Jude Hospital was founded 
by entertainer Danny Thomas, 
and operates primarily from pub­
lic contributions.

COUPLE CELEBRATES  
GOLDEN ANNIVERSARY

Mr. and Mrs. Elbert Stephens 
were guests of honor at a re­
ception in observance of their 
fiftieth wedding anniversary 
Sunday afternoon in the Pioneer 
Room of the First State Bank. 
Hosting the party were their 
children, Margaret Thornton of 
Denver City, Jerry Stephens of 
Bokoshe, Oklahoma, and Wayne 
Stephens of Silverton.

The reception table was cover­
ed with a pale gold cloth over­
laid with a hand-crocheted ecru 
cloth. “ Golden Anniversary” 
punch was served from a crystal

bowl. The cake was a four-tier 
confection decorated in shades of 
gold. The tiers were separated 
with gold columns with an ar­
rangement of “ 50th” wreaths and 
roses between the columns. Each 
tier was decorated with fifty gold 
roses and leaves. Spiced pecans 
and white chocolate tinted pale 
gold in the shapes of wedding 
bells and roses were served from 
crystal dishes.

The centerpiece was an ar­
rangement of pale gold roses 
and bronze daisies in a brass 
champagne cooler.

The reception was catered by 
“ Special Occasions,” owned by 
Elaine LaBaume and Frances 
Easter of Floydada.

LUPE GARCIA QUALIFIES 
FOR REGIONAL 
SHORTHAND COMPETITION

Lupe Garcia won second place
in the District University Inter­
scholastic League shorthand con­
test, and is eligible to compete 
on the regional level. Her class-

mate, Melinda Sutton, placed 
third in the contest.

The picture memory team, 
composed of Ron McCune, Clay 
Mercer, Tracy Tomlin and Pen­
ni Fogerson, tied for first place 
in district competition, but the 
elementary and junior high 
students do not go on to the

regional level.
Carrie Ann Grabbe won second 

place in district story telling. 
Bradley Brunson placed fifth 
and Brian West was sixth in the 
same contest.

Suzann Settle placed sixth in 
seventh and eighth grade ready 
writing.
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WHITE, S E LF , DAVENPORT & BASS

Attorneys at law 
601 West 7th 

Plainview, Texas 79072 
(806) 293-8463

ANNOUNCE THE OPENING OF

Their Tulia Office

Located at 
808 Southwest 2nd 
Tulia, Texas 79088 

(806) 995-2314

Attorneys:

Charles G. White 
Ed Self

Erwin Davenport 
Bob Bass
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McFall - Whifener Vows Exchanged
On Saturday evening, February 

27, 1982, Beth McFall repeated 
wedding vows with Gene White- 
ner at the candlelit altar of the 
First United Methodist Church in 
Quitaque.

Rev. Wayne Norman, pastor of 
the church, officiated at the cere­
mony.

Parents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. Sid McFall of Quitaque 
and Mr. and Mrs. Paul White-

TOSVSULV : 'î BTSa

LET US ALL 
ATTEND THE 
CHURCH OF 
OUR CHOICE 
EASTER MORN

' f .

As you sing 

Your Hymns of Praise

Eastertime
Please accept our

GREETINGS
and best wishes for a 

Happy Easter

In observance of this holiday, 
we will he dosed Sunday, April 11

THE COFFEE SHOP

C A R O L  S T O D G H I L L
is now associated with

The Upper R o n
Professional Men's and 
Women's Hair Styling

4933 Brownfield Hwy. Lubbock 
792-2287

She is now offering a 
25% DISCOUNT

So all Silverfon Guys and Girls 
asking for Carol.

MRS. GENE WHITENER

☆ ' ☆  ☆  
ner of Paducah.

The bride’s dress, made by 
her, was of nylon velour with 
long sleeves gathered at the 
wrists. Tiny buttons on the shoul­
der accented the draped neck­
line. A wide gold belt emphasiz­
ed the waistline.

The bridal bouquet was center­
ed with an ivory silk rose, sur­
rounded by baby’s breath and 
dusty rose carnations clustered 
in a lace cup with ribbon stream­
ers of the carnations.

To carry out the tradition of 
something old, the bride wore a 
strand of pearls borrowed from 
her mother, and something blue 
was her birthstone ring. She had 
a penny in each shoe with the 
birth years of herself and the 
groom minted on them. Some­
thing new was her dress. In her 
hair she wore a lace covered 
comb with some ribbons and 
carnations of dusty rose.

A reception followed the cere­
mony in the fellowship hall of 
the church. A serving table cov­
ered with dusty rose overlaid 
with a crocheted cloth made by 
the bride’s maternal grandmoth­
er, featured a bride and groom. 
The table was lighted with a 
rose candle. Mrs. Jo Ann McFall, 
aunt of the bride, served straw­
berry punch at a table covered 
with a white lace cloth underlaid 
with rose. Centered on this table 
was the bride’s bouquet flanked 
by rose candles. The three tier­
ed white iced rectangle cake was 
decorated with dusty rose roses 
cascading down one side with 
other roses scattered over the 
cake. White doves nestled among 
the roses.

The cake was served by Mrs.

Mr. and Mrs. May To 
Celebrate Fortieth
Anniversary

Mr. and Mrs. Edwin May will 
celebrate their fortieth wedding 
anniversary Sunday, April 11, 
from 2:00 until 4:00 p.m. at their

Couple Marries 
In Amarillo

Miss Frances Ann Cerbantes 
and Jesse Michael DeLeon were 
married March 19, 1982 in Amar­
illo.

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Pete Cerbantes of 
Silverton, and the bridegroom is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Can­
delaria.

They are making their home in 
Amarillo, where she is a lab tech­
nician for Dr. Lindsey Taylor, 
and he is employed by Southwes­
tern Public Service Company.

Roy Shepperd, grandmother of 
the bride. Jack McFall, uncle of 
the bride, served coffee to the 
guests. Handmade rose mints 
with green leaf mints were ser­
ved on a milk glass plate.

The bride wore a turquoise 
suede long sleeved dress with 
gold and white accessories for 
traveling. After a honeymoon in 
Red River, New Mexico, the 
couple is at home in Paducah, 
where the bridegroom is employ­
ed by The Texas State Highway 
Department. The bride attended 
Motley County High School and 
received her degree in home eco­
nomics at Texas Tech, in Decem­
ber of 1981. The groom graduat­
ed from Paducah High School 
and attended Clarendon Junior 
College.

Attending the wedding in addi­
tion to the parents and pastor 
were Mrs. S. 0. McFall, Quitaque; 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Sheppard, 
Throckmorton; Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
McFall and Justin, Silverton; Mr. 
and Mrs. Bennie Whitener and 
sons, Childress; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ron Cornett, Hollis, Oklahoma; 
Mr. and Mrs. Bruce McFall and 
girls, Muleshoe; Mrs. Becky Nor­
man and girls.

Courtesies field for the couple 
included a couples shower at 
Quitaque, a bridal shower at Pa­
ducah, and a lingerie shower at 
Lubbock for the bride, hosted 
by Debbie Ulrich and Mica Ro­
bertson.
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home at 607 Broadway in Silver- 
ton.

Hosting the event will be the 
couples’ children, Larry May of 
Plainview, Mrs. Sheryl Breedlove 
of Breckenridge. and Thurman 
May of Amarillo. The couple 
also has five grandchildren.

Relatives and friends are in­
vited to attend the open house.

Mrs. May, the former Claudine 
Thurman, is the daughter of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. Carl Thurman, 
who made their home in Tulia. 
Mr. May is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. O. E. May of Silverton. The 
couple were married April 14, 
1942, in Carlsbad, New Mexico.

They have lived in Silverton 
26 years. He is a plumber and 
she is librarian for the Silverton 
Library.

Miss Pickens Is 
Shower Honoree

Miss Jan Pickens, bride-elect 
of Brent Bean, was guest of hon­
or at a coffee and miscellaneous 
shower from 9:30 until 11:00 a.m. 
on Saturday, April 3, in the Pio­
neer Room at First State Bank.

Guests were greeted by Mrs. 
LaRue Garvin and presented to 
the honoree and her fiance, to 
her mother, Mrs. Nancy Pickens, 
and to the mother of the pros­
pective bridegroom, Mrs. Bobbye 
Bean.

The refreshment table was cov­
ered with a lace-trimmed ecru 
cloth and the centerpiece was an 
arrangement of dusty rose silk 
flowers. Brass accessories were 
used to serve sausage pinwheels, 
cheese pennies, orange coconut 
balls, Neiman Marcus bars, cof­
fee and perked spiced tea. Mrs. 
Janette LeBoeuf presided at the 
serving table.

Hostsses for the occasion were 
Mmes. Lois Walker, Shirley Rey­
nolds, Polly Jarrett, Janelle 
Reeves, Janette LeBoeuf, LaRue 
Garvin, Sharon Simpson, Rita 
Mullin, Pat Fitzgerald, Earlene 
Ledbetter, Jessie Bomar, Mary 
Ann Rauch, Anne McMurtry, Lois 
Ziegler, Rosemary Perkins, Fran­
ces Kellum, Dora Storie, Theta 
Holt, Marge Jones, LaJuana Mc- 
Jimsey and Norma Payne.

Guests from out of town in­
cluded Mrs. Kenneth Bean, Mrs. 
Donald Bean and Mrs. Philip 
Smitherman of Floydada; Mrs. 
Bill Verden and Russel of Earth; 
Mrs. Johnny Henry of Canyon; 
Mrs. Jimmy Wilson of Olton; 
Mrs. Jo Lacy of Turkey; Mrs. 
Dub Mercer and Mrs. Hilburn 
Casey of Lockney.

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Don Wil­
son and baby of Amarillo visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Spud Tiffin, other 
friends and relatives here over 
the weekend.

Weekend visitors in the Elton 
Cantwell home were Mark and 
Debbie Burk of Raton, New Mex­
ico; Jewel Fleming and Mary 
Chris Cantwell of Amarillo, and 
Brenda Avent, Brenda Cantwell 
and Roger Cantwell of Canyon. 
Joining them on Sunday for a 
family dinner were Nina Martin 
of Kress; Celia Martin of Amar­
illo; Earl and Inetha Cantwell, 
Dana, Dorothy, Brian and Kami
POLITICAL ANNOUNCEMENTS

Subject to Action of the 
Democratic Primary

For United States Representa­
tive, 13th Congressional District 
of Texas:

JACK HIGHTOWER
Vernon, Texas

(Re-election)
☆

For State Representative, 84th 
Legislative District of Texas: 

FOSTER WHALEY
(Re-election)

Pampa, Texas
☆

For Commissioner, Briscoe Coun­
ty Precinct 4:

BRYANT EDDLEMAN
(Re-election)

Silverton, Texas 
CHARLES (Mule) GRANTHAM 

Silverton, Texas
☆

For Judge, Briscoe County, Tex­
as:

FRED W. MERCER
(Re-election)

Silverton, Texas

For County and District Clerk, 
Briscoe County, Texas:

b e s s  McW il l ia m s
(Re-election)

Silverton, Texas
☆

For Treasurer. Briscoe County, 
Texas:

MILDRED J. REID
(Re-election)

Silverton, Texas
☆

For Justice of the Peace, Briscoe 
County Precinct 1:

BARBARA PIGG
(Re-election)

Silverton, Texas

Martin, Stan, Roma, Wayne, Ky James Zorger visited in the al­
and (Bobby Martin. Ninette and temoon.
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BASKETS, GRASS, NOVELTIES 

FOR EASTER

Seek and Find Toys
708 Sixth 828-2468 Silverton

CANNON’S CONSTRUCTION
Where QUALITY is First 

Custom Homes 
Remodeling, Painting,

Roofing, Fencing 
Specializing in Custom-Built Cabinets

MONTE CANNON
806-995-4310 Tulia, Texas

*

The Congregation Of The 

C H U R C H  O F  C H R I S T

Meeting At Rock Creek
EXTENDS A GRACIOUS WELCOME TO ALL TO 

ATTEND ANY AND ALL OF OUR SERVICES.
Morning Worship ................................... ................................  10:30 a.m .
Evening Worship .................................................................... 6:00 p.m.

WEDNESDAY
Evening ............... 7:00 p.m.

Ray leeple Fertilizers, Inc.
Proper Fertilizer Blends
Insecticides - Herbicides 

Custom Application
Airplane -  Ground Rig 
Tool Bar Rigs Furnished

Phone 847-2620

SILVERTON WELL SERVICE
823-20(1

Silverton, Texas

Jack Davis
823-2263

Leon Lavy 
823-2188

TREFLAN
5 Gallons -  - $150.00 

30 Gallons - - $895.00 
Your Farm Chemical Needs

PRODUCERS COOPERATIVE ELEVATOR 
983-2821 
Floydada
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Public Notice
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: THE UNKNOWN STOCK­
HOLDERS OF JAGUAR 
OIL COMPANY

GREETING:
You are commanded to appear 
by filing a written answer to the 
plaintiff’s petition at or before 
10 o’clock A. M. of the first Mon­
day after the expiration of 42 
days from the date of issuance of 
this Citation, the same being 
Monday the 3rd day of May, A. 
D., 1982, at or before 10 o’clock 
A. M., before the Honorable Dis­
trict Court of Briscoe County, at 
the Court House in Silverton, 
Texas.
Said plaintiff’s petition was filed 
on the 12th day of March, 1982. 

; The file number of said suit be­
ing No. 2302.
Tlje names of the parties in said 

: suit are:
. R. P. FULLER and LLOYD EL- 
i AINE FULLER as Plaintiff, and 
: THE UNKNOWN STOCKHOLD- 
' ERS OF JAGUAR OIL COM- 
• PANY as Defendant.

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to-wit: 
Suit to cancel Deed dated Novem­
ber 30, 1953, recorded in Volume 
50, page 52 of the Deed Records 
of Briscoe County, Texas, on the 
following described property lo­
cated in Briscoe County, Texas, 
and to quiet title to said mineral 
interest, to-wit: All of a tract of 
land out of the West part of the 
South Two-Thirds of Section 158, 
in Block G & M, Certificate 
4/611 G. C. & S. F. R.R. Co. Sur­
vey and described by metes and 
bounds as follows: BEGINNING 
at the Southwest corner of said 
Section 158 for the Southwest 
and beginning comer of this 
tract THENCE North 1267.2 var- 
as to a point in the West line of 
said Section 158, for the North­
west corner of this tract; 
THENCE East 1009.1 varas to a 
point for the Northeast corner of 
this tract; THENCE South 1267.2 
varas to a point in the South line 
of said Section 158 for the South­
east corner of this tract; 
THENCE West 1009.1 varas to 
the PLACE OF BEGINNING, con­
taining 226-% acres, more or 
less. >
If this Citation is not served 
within 90 days after the date of 
its issuance, it shall be returned 
un served.
Issued this the 12th day of March 
A. D., 1982.
Given under my hand and seal of 
said Court, at office in Silverton, 
Texas, this the 12th day of 
March A. D., 1982.

/ s /  Bess McWilliams 
District Clerk 
Court Briscoe County,
Texas

(Seal)
: NO. 2302

R. P. FULLER and wife,
LLOYD ELAINE FULLER 
VS.
THE UNKNOWN STOCK­
HOLDERS OF JAGUAR 
OIL COMPANY

IN THE DISTRICT COURT 
OF

BRISCOE COUNTY, TEXAS 
APPLICATION FOR CITATION 

BY PUBLICATION- 
UNKNOWN STOCKHOLDERS

AUBREY J. FOUTS, attorney for 
Plaintiffs in the above entitled 
and numbered cause, being duly 
sworn, says that the names of 
the stockholders of JAGUAR OIL 
COMPANY against whom the ab­
ove entitled and numbered pro­
ceeding has been brought are un­
known to Affiant and to the 
Plaintiffs therein, and that after 
due diligence on the part of the 
Affiant and the Plaintiffs, they 
or either of them have been un­
able to locate the whereabouts of 
said Unknown Stockholders, 
wherefore, he prays that a cita­
tion be issued for service by pub­
lication.

CARR, EVANS, FOUTS 
& HUNT 
P. O. Box 2585 
Lubbock, Texas 79408 
806/765-7491
/s /  AUBREY J. FOUTS 
State Bar 07315000 
Attorney for Plaintiffs 

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED 
BEFORE ME this 11th day of 
March, 1982.

/s /  Patricia L. Franklin 
NOTARY PUBLIC 
Lubbock County, Texas 

ENDORSEMENT
FILED this 12th day of March, 
1982, at 9:00 o’clock, A. M.

/s /  Bess McWilliams 
DISTRICT CLERK 
Briscoe County, Texas 

NO. 2302
R. P. FULLER, and wife,
LLOYD ELAINE FULLER 
VS.
THE UNKNOWN STOCK­
HOLDERS OF JAGUAR 
OIL COMPANY

IN THE DISTRICT COURT

OF
BRISCOE COUNTY, TEXAS 

PLAINTIFFS1 
ORIGINAL PETITION

TO THE HONORABLE JUDGE 
OF SAID COURT:

NOW COME R. P. FULLER, 
and wife, LLOYD ELAINE FUL­
LER, hereinafter called Plain­
tiffs, complaining of THE UN 
KNOWN STOCKHOLDERS OF 
JAGUAR OIL COMPANY, a de 
funct corporation, and as 
grounds therefor, would show to 
the Court the following:

I.

The Plaintiffs, R. P. FULLER 
and LLOYD ELAINE FULLER, 
are residents of Lubbock, Hub- 
bock County, Texas. The resi­
dence of the Defendants is un­
known, and the names and iden­
tities of the Stockholders of JA­
GUAR OIL COMPANY, a defunct 
corporation, are unknown to the 
Plaintiffs. Service of process 
should be obtained upon the De­
fendants by publication pursu­
ant to the provisions of Rule 111, 
Rule 114, and Rule 115, of the 
Texas Rules of Civil Procedure. 
The property which is the sub­
ject of this proceeding accrued 
to the Stockholders of JAGUAR 
OIL COMPANY when it became a 
defunct corporation on Septem­
ber 1, 1956, by having its char­
ter forfeited pursuant to Article 
7096, Revised Civil Statutes of 
Texas, for failure to pay fran­
chise taxes in the State of Texas.

n.
Plaintiffs would show that 

heretofore, to-wit, prior to July 
1, 1954, they were the owners, in 
fee simple, of an undivided one- 
fourth interest in all of the oil, 
gas and other minerals in, under 
or which may be produced from 
the following lands situated in 
Briscoe County, Texas, to-wit:

All of a tract of land out of the 
West part of the South Two- 
Thirds of Section 158, in Block 
G & M. Certificate 4/611 G.C. 
& S.F. R.R. Co. Survey and des­
cribed by metes and bounds as 
follows:
BEGINNING at the Southwest 
corner of said Section 158 for 
the Southwest and beginning 
corner of this tract;
THENCE North 1267.2 varas to 
a point in the West line of said 
Section. 158, for the Northwest 
corner of this tract;
THENCE East 1009.1 varas to a 
point for the Northeast corner 
of this tract;
THENCE South 1267.2 varas to 
a point ip the South line of 
said Section 158 for the South­
east corner of this tract. 
THENCE West 1009.1 varas to 
the PLACE OF BEGINNING, 
containing 226-% acres, more 
or less.

HI.
By a Mineral Deed dated No­

vember 30, 1953, but delivered 
subsequent to June 23, 1954, and 
recorded July 1, 1954, in Volume 
50, Page 52-54, of the Deed Re­
cords of Briscoe County, Texas, 
R. P. FULLER and wife, LLOYD 
ELAINE PULLER, purported to 
convey an undivided one-half 
(%) interest in all of the oil, gas 
and other minerals in, under or 
which may be produced from the 
above described property to JA­
GUAR OIL COMPANY in a trans­
action whereby JAGUAR OIL 
COMPANY was to pay the 
agreed consideration for said 
conveyance by a draft or check. 
The draft or check of the pur­
chaser was not honored and the 
consideration to be paid for the 
conveyance of said mineral inter­
est was not paid to the Grantors. 
Thereafter, for the purpose of 
rescinding said transaction on or 
about August 16, 1954, JAGUAR 
OIL COMPANY executed and de­
livered its Mineral Deed recon­
veying the above described in­
terest to R. P. FULLER and 
LLOYD ELAINE FULLER, but 
the Plaintiffs have lost or mis­
placed said Deed, and it was not 
recorded. Plaintiffs would show 
that there was a total failure of 
consideration for the execution 
and delivery of the original Min­
eral Deed to JAGUAR OTL COM­
PANY mentioned above, and 
Plaintiffs seek cancellation of 
said Mineral Deed.

IV.
Plaintiffs would show that they 

are entitled to cancellation of the 
above described Mineral Deed to 
JAGUAR OIL COMPANY for fail­
ure of consideration and for 
judgment quieting title to an un­
divided one-fourth (Vi) interest 
in the minerals in, under or 
which may be produced from the 
above described property.

V.
Plaintiffs would further show 

that there was an error in the 
Mineral Deed purported to con­
vey an undivided one-half (%) 
interest in the oil, gas and other 
minerals in, under or which may 
be produced from the above des­
cribed property, whereas the 
Plaintiffs only owned an undivi­
ded one-fourth (%) interest in

Health Is Topic 

Of Club Program
Mrs. Lois Nance presented 

the program for the Southwes­
tern Extension Homemakers 
Club Tuesday, March 26 when the 
group met in the home of Mrs. 
Georgia Allard.

Mrs. Nance spoke on health, 
giving daily guides for good 
health. A fitness game, with not- 
too-vigorous exercise, was enjoy­
ed by each one present.

The hostess gave the devotion­
al from Psalms 121, “Lift Up My 
Eyes,” stating that “we often fail 
to offer enough praise and 
thanks.”

Roll call was answered with 
health tips.

President Lanita Cantwell an­
nounced that the Commissioners’ 
Luncheon will be Thursday, Ap­
ril 30, at the First Baptist 
Church. Each member is to bring 
a casserole dish and a printed 
recipe therefor.

said minerals, they having pre­
viously conveyed an undivided 
one-fourth (%) interest in said 
minerals to ROY FURR. Plain­
tiffs seek judgment declaring 
that their mineral interest in the 
above described property is an 
undivided one-fourth (%) inter­
est rather than an undivided one- 
half (%) interest.

WHEREFORE, PREMISES 
CONSIDERED, Plaintiffs pray 
that the Defendants be cited ac­
cording to law to appear herein 
and that upon hearing hereof, 
Plaintiffs have judgment cancel­
ing the above described Mineral 
Deed and quieting title to the 
above mentioned mineral inter­
est in Plaintiffs. Plaintiffs seek 
recovery of all costs of court and 
general relief.

CARR, EVANS, FOUTS 
& HUNT 
P. O. Box 2585 
Lubbock, Texas 79408 
806/765-7491 
/ s /  AUBREY J. FOUTS 

State Bar 07315000

Plans were completed for at­
tending the District Meeting at 
Snyder March 30. The state cook­
book (price $10.00) was shown.

Mrs. Frances Kellum was elec­
ted vice-president for the remain­
der of the club year due to the 
resignation of Mrs. Glenda Fran­
cis.

Mrs. Cantwell was elected 
TEHA chairman for 1983.

The next club meeting will be 
May 28 in the home of Mrs. 
Francis.

Delicious refreshments were 
served to nine members: Mmes. 
Florene Fitzgerald, Lois Ziegler,

L I N E S  FROM
Y
N
D
A

Lynda Fogerson

Briscoe County Extension Agent

BLAZER SHORTCOURSE
Need a new spring blazer to 

add to your wardrobe?

Theta Holt, Christene King, Sy­
bil Teeple, Frances Kellum, La­
nita Cantwell, Lois Nance and 
Georgia Allard.

No matter what new “ trends” 
are in for spring and summer, a 
classic tailored blazer is always
a welcome addition in anyone’s 
closet.

If you have never done tailor­
ing or if you are a pro at cus­
tom tailoring, yôu may want to 
enroll in a Spring Blazer Short- 
course. I have given first prior­
ity to those on the waiting list 
from the Blazer Workshop I 
taught in January. These have 
chosen to have a shortcourse me­
thod rather than a workshop. 
We will set up approximately 
three meeting dates when I will

demonstrate techniques and 
steps. Participants will sew at 
home at their own pace and come 
back for a demonstration of the 
next steps. I will be available on 
certain dates for individual help 
as needed.

There is no cost and the class 
is limited to 20 with this method.

If you are interested, call my 
office, 823-2343, to put your 
name on the list. We will have 
the first meeting at 2:00 p.m. on 
April 15 at the City Hall to dis­
cuss fabric selection, pattern se­
lection, interfacing, preparation, 
and beginning techniques.

A n  air conditioner c a n  
im p ro v e  th e p e rfo rm a n c e  

of y o u r 
fu rn a c e .

A n  air c o n d itio n e r?
A very special air conditioner called the add-on heat pump. I ;ummer and heats in winter.

And it works with whatever kind of furnace you have.
The add-on heat pump will improve the performance of your h / keeping it off completely dur­

ing a good portion of the winter. The add-on heat pump can sa t it . ,  , our home’s heating requirements 
more economically when temperatures are above 30° or so. That’s about 80% of our area’s normal 
heating season.

Then, when summer comes, the heat pump becomes a cool pump, efficiently air conditioning the 
home. So, when you’re in the market for air conditioning, look into the add-on heat pump.

Call us to see what your savings could be.

S O U T H W E S T E R N  PU BLIC  S E R V IC E  C O M P A N Y 909.3

12-4tc

^
SILVERTON, TEXAS

OFFERS HIE E M M
SERVICES

N 0 W ACCOUNTS 

PASSBOOKS SAVINGS 

REGULAR CERTIFICATE OF DEPOSITS

M ONEY MARKET CERTIFICATE OF
DEPOSITS (at pvernment rates)

FR EE: SOCIAL SECURITY DIRECT 
DEPOSITS

FREE: CHECKING TO SENIOR CITIZENS 
(65 anil older)

.«>■!! _ro s e

We invite yon to use our Bank-by-mail Service and Wire-Transfer Service.



ASSEMBLY OF GOD
Mrs. Marilyn Bridges, Pastor

Sunday
Sunday School----------------9:45 a.m.
Worship Service—--------11:00 a.m.
Evening Service------------- 6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Worship Service----------- 7:00 p.m.

☆

SILVERTON 
CHURCH OF CHRIST
Gerald Beasley, Minister 

Sunday
Sunday School---------------- 9:00 a.m.
Morning Worship______ 10:00 a.m.
Evening Worship------------6:00 p.m.

Wednesday
Bible Study-------------------- 7:00 p.m.

☆
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH

Royce Denton, Pastor

Sunday
Library Opens— ----- .—9:15 am
Sunday School------------. _9:45 am
Worship Service--------- _11:00 am
Library Opens------------ -4 :3 0 pm.
Youth Choir--------------- . -4:30 pm.
Training Union---------- -5 :0 0 p.m.
Mission Friends, GA.

and R.A. -------------„5:00 pm.
Evening Worship—— —6:00 p.m.

Second Monday
Night W.M.S____ ______7:00 p.m.

Second and Fourth Tuesday
W. M. S. ______________ 9:30 a.m.

Wednesday
Junior High Acteens____3:35 p.m.
High School Acteens, first 

and third Wednesday—3:35 p.m.
Mid-Week Service------— 7:00 p.m.
Choir Rehearsal------------ 7:45 pm.

Second Saturday
Baptist Men__________—7:00 am

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 

CHURCH

Pastor: Rev. Billy Wilson

Sunday
Sunday School__________ 9:45 a m

Worship Service_______ 11:00 am

M. Y. F-------------------------5:00 pm

Evening Worship_______ 6:00 pm

Wednesday
Choir Practice___________6:00 pm

☆

NEW FELLOWSHIP BAPTIST 

MISSION

Sunday
Sunday School__________ 9:45 » ™
Worship Service_______ 11:00 am
Training Union_________ 5:00 pm
Evening Service_________6:00 pm

Wednesday
Choir Rehearsal_________7:00 pm
Prayer Service----------------8:00 pm

☆

OUR LADY OF LORETO 
CATHOLIC CHURCH

Sunday
Mass----- ;--------------------- 10:00 am

☆

ROCK CREEK  
CHURCH OF CHRIST

Sunday
Worship Service_______ 10:30 am
Evening Worship_______6:00 pm

Wednesday
Worship Service________ 7:00 p m.

JONES DEPT. STORE BROWN - M tM U R TR Y IMPLEMENT (0 . GARVIN OIL COMPANY

SILVERTON AUTO PARTS SILV ERTO N W ELL SERVICE SILVERTON OIL COMPANY

BRISCOE COUNTY NEWS BRISCOE COOPERATIVES RHODE PIPE COMPANY

JERRY'S MALT SHOP F0 6 ER SO N  TOM BER & S U P P LY SILVERTON FUNERAL HOME

JACK'S PHARMACY FIRST STATE B A N K G R A B B E - SIMPSON CHEVROLET CO,

RAY THOMPSON IMPLEMENT CO, INC. V E R O N  B. TOWE AGENCY
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£ T LOOKING 
V FOR A JOB? 
LOOKING 

FOR HELP?

For Sale
STALEY MINERALS HAVE long 
been recognized as the tops in 
their field. We have a good 
supply of Bloat Block and HI 
Mag, all purpose mineral in 
stock, by the ton or by block. 
Lone Star Chemical, Silverton, 
823-2376. 48-tfc

" T f f i f f T W/fo

SEE BROWN - McMURTRY FOR 
your International Electric 
Fences, Insulators and Wire.

38-tfc
FOR SALE: MAYTAG WASHERS 

and Dryers. Service and Parts. 
Fogerson Lumber & Supply.

13-tfc

MAC'S BACKHOE SERVICE
Call Harvey McJimsey 

Silverton, Texas

r & T to c K
Your Nearest H & R BLOCK 

Office Is Located At 
106 WEST MISSOURI STR EET  

FLOYDADA, TEXAS  
Phone 983-5233

2-14-tc

ORCHID CORSAGE EASTER 
Special. Potpourri. See Page 2.

13-2tc
COUCH, ALMOST-NEW COOK- 

stove, refrigerator and washer 
for sale. 823-2197. 14-3tc

Liquid OH FILL CHEMICALS. 
Complete Line, Custom Mixed 
in our plant. Water and Oil 
Test. L-Chem, 413 West 24th, 
Plainview. Phone 296-5555 or 
293-3227. 10-8tp

NEW OH FHL PIPE. We buy 
right and can sell right. Any 
size. L-Chem, 413 West 24th, 
Plainview. Phone 296-5555 or 
293-3227. 10-8tp

FOR SALE: EVERSMAN CAMEL 
backed float and two cattle 
guards, 21’x6\ Call 847-2555.

11-tfc
NEED A V-BELT? BROWN - Mc- 

Murtry Implement now has a 
good stock of V-Belts in the 
most needed sizes. 30-tfc

OLD SCRATCH CATTLE O H  
ers: Sales, Service, Parts and 
Insecticides available through 
Henry T. Hamblen, Wayside, 
Texas. 806-764-3461. 27-tfc

MAKE US YOUR CULTIVATOR 
and Tillage Tool Headquarters. 
We have Graham - Hoeme, Ad­
ams, Nichols, and IH—both in 
plain and hardfaced. Brown- 
McMurtry Implement, Silver- 
ton, Texas. 17-tfc

Diamond Industrial Supply Co., Inc.
Phone Days 296-7418 — Nights 293-1200 or 296-7828 

1014 Broadway 
Plainview, Texas

SKF BCA TIMKEN BOWER 
'iflfe Appreciate Your Business More"

Chain U-Joints
Sprockets Oil Seats
V-Beits O-Rings
Sheaves Wisconsin

FARM EURF.au INSURANCE CO'S.
Phone 808/823-2189 or 823-2087

METAL DINETTE SET WITH 
two leaves and six chairs; good 
condition, $75.00. Full-size 
Sealy cotton mattress; clean 
cover, $15.00. Full-size inner- 
spring mattress and springs; 
clean, $35.00. Daphne McGav- 
ock, 823-2120. 14-ltc

1975 CHRYSLER CORDOBA FOR 
Sale. Rickey Minyard, 823-2108.

14-tfnc

D S . 0 .  R . H d K T O S H
O P T O M E T R IS T

South Main Street Phone 983-3460
FLOYDADA, TEXAS

10  SAVE M ONEY FOR 
FARM BUREAU MEMBERS

38% off Regular Rate with Texas Farm Bureau Mutual In­
surance Company's Deviation.
FARM & RANCH OWNERS AND HOMEOWNERS POLICIES

COMPETITIVE RATES ON 
AUTO, FARM LIABILITY, COMMERCIAL, L IF E ,  

RETIREM EN T, CROP HAIL
SOUTHERN FARM BUREAU LIFE 

SOUTHERN FARM BUREAU CASUALTY 
TEXAS FARM BUREAU INSURANCE CO.

S E E  ME AT
BRISCOE COUNTY FARM BUREAU OFFICE 

FLU TE HUTSELL AGENCY MANAGER %
TOMMY EDWARDS CARRIER AGENT -  423-1083

HUTSELL
INSURANCE 

AGENCY
Silverton, Texas 9 ____

aassaaBa

LET US HELP YOU

WITH YOUR FERTILIZER

AND CHEMICAL NEEDS

BR’SCOE
00PERAT ES

Th is is Your Business - 
Use It!

FOR SALE: ONE NEW INTER- 
national Electric 23-inch Hedge 
Trimmer. Won at drawing, no 
hedge to trim. Tobe Riddell, 
847-2528. 14-2tc

CLOSEOUT ON RADIOS FOR 
66 series Tractors. AM only 
$52.49 and AM-FM just $68.24 
as long as our supply lasts. 
Brown - McMurtry Implement 
Company, 823-2441. 1 3 t21;c

~FOR SALEfWE ARE A DEALER 
for Sanitas Wallpaper. Prompt 
delivery. Sample books avail­
able. Fogerson Lumber & Sup­
ply. 34-tfc

MOORMAN'S FEEDS
To better utilize your grazing, 

use Moorman 
Mineral and Protein 

It Pays to Figure Cost 
DONNIE MARTIN 
Silverton, Texas

YETTER ROTARY REPLACE- 
ment rotary hoe wheels for 
most makes of rotary hoes only 
$25.00 each. Carry a spare at 
this price. Replacement bear­
ings only $3.71 each. Brown- 
McMurtry Implement Com­
pany, 823-2441. 13-tfc

F a s t e r  c a r d s  a n d  gifts^
Lilies and Corsages. Call Pot­
pourri, 823-2073. 12-3tc

TREFLAN AND OTHER FARM 
Chemicals competitively pric­
ed. Liquid Blends Available. 
Check with us first. Lone Star 
Chemical, 823-2376 or 652-2761.

3-tfc
BUY — SELL — TRADE: COL- 

lector Spurs — Bits — Knives 
— Guns — Watches — Jewel­
ry and Antiques. Lone Star 
Chemical, Silverton, Texas.

3-tfc
“FOR SALE: TRASH BARRELS. 

Silverton Fire Department. 
Ask at City Hall. 31-tfnc

FOR SALE: AN OLDER 5-ROOM 
House in Tulia. Has 345 foot 
frontage, 205 foot depth. 995- 
2774. 507 NE Third. 7-tfc

FOR SALE: 1U0% PURE ALOE 
Vera Juice; also Eucalyptus 
Heat Rub. Over 70% Aloe with 
Jojoba. 823-2339. 51-tfc

Real Estate
HOUSE FOR SALE: TWO BED- 

room, 1% baths, utility room, 
cellar. Garage. On corner lot. 
807 Loretta Street. Phone 823- 
2146. 19-tfc

CENTRAL PLAINS REALTORS
New Brick Home, 506 Saye Street 

Two bedroom Brick Home,
705 Braidfoot Street 

Let us list your residential, bus­
iness or farm property for better 
results with large range of ad­

vertising area. 
BARBARA PIGG 

Sales Representative 
Call for Appointment to 

see homes
823-2265 or 823-2115

FOR SALE OR RENT: THREE 
bedroom house. Charles Gran­
tham, 823-2377. 404 Briscoe.

8-tfc

Services
FOR ALL TYPES OF Concrete 

work, remodeling, new con­
struction, residential or com­
mercial call Rice Construction, 
995-2750. 10-tfc

DRY CLEANING, LAUNDRY: 
Briscoe County News is the 
Silverton pick-up station for 
Tulia Steam Laundry. Clothes 
are picked up and delivered on 
Thursdays. 24-tfc

Archie Castleberry
FOR ALL YOUR 

L IF E  INSURANCE 
HOSPITALIZATION

NEEDS -  USE 
and

SOUTHLAND L IF E
11th and Washington 

Amarillo, Texas

Underground 
irrigation Pipe 

Plisfic Gas Pipe 
PHODE PIPE CO.

823-2458 - 823-2459 
Silverton, Texas

ALUMINUM PIPE 
STRAIGHTENED 
AND REPAIRED

Even if it’s been flattened, we 
can fix it.

ELTON CANTWELL 
847-2668

10- tfc

and Insecticide Spraying. We 
have two ground rigs and air­
plane. Lone Star Chemical.

11- tfc
SINGER lSEWING MACHINES, 

Vacuum Cleaners, Smith Cor­
ona Typewriters, Adding Ma­
chines, Kirby Sales and Ser­
vice. Buy here, service here. 
Call in Silverton, 823-2333. Of­
fice located at 620 Noel in 
Memphis. Here every two 
weeks on Thursdays. 21-tfc

INSULATION INSTALLED AND 
guaranteed. Fire resistant. 
Marr Insulation Co., 652-3593, 
Lockney, or call Flute Hutsell.

11-tfc

LOCKSMITH. LOCKS OPENED. 
Locks repaired. Keys made for 
locks that have no keys. Dupli­
cate keys made. Deadbolts in­
stalled. 24-hour mobile service 
throughout area. Don Probas- 
co. Pro-Lock Shop, 983-3834. 15 
miles south of Silverton, High­
way 207. 14-tfc

MACKENZIE““  TRAILER PARK: 
Complete Hookups Available 
for Campers or Mobile Momes. 
Overnight. Weekly or Monthly 
Rates. V2  block north of Floy­
dada turnoff. Robert and 
Carlye Hill, owners. 34-tfc

For Rent

We want to express our heart­
felt thanks to each of you for 
your prayers, get-well cards, 
food, flowers, calls, visits and to 
the ambulance crew while I was 
in the hospital and at home.

May God bless you all.
J. L. (Shorty) and Ruth West

CARD OF THANKS
Thank you for the prayers, 

visits, food, flowers, candy and 
being so concerned while I was 
in the hospital and since I have 
been home.

Doug Forbes

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to express our 

sincere appreciation for the 
beautiful flowers, the memorials, 
cards, calls, and every act of 
friendship and condolence at our 
time of sorrow.

Your kindness and caring will 
always be remembered.

The Paul Webb family

CARD OF THANKS

1973 CHEVROLET Vz-TON PICK- 
up For Sale. Buck Hardin.

14-ltp
LETTER AND OFFSET  

PRESS PRINTING 
BRISCOE COUNTY NEWS

SMALL DITCHING MACHINE 
and Electric Concrete Mixer 
For Lease. Fogerson Lumber & 
Supply. 24-tfc

“ONE BEDROOM FURNISHED 
Apartment For Rent. Dewey 
Estes, 823-2451 or 823-2148.

11-tfc

LOCKNEY MEAT COMPANY
Kill Days Monday through Friday 

CUSTOM PROCESSING 
Half and Quarter Cut, Wrapped, 

Frozen and Fully Guaranteed 
SAM & K ELLY  FORTENBERRY 

652-3305
Corner of U.S. 70 and 
Farm Road 378 South

11-tfc

Wanted

SAVINGS — INSULATE YOUR 
own home (it’s easy) for sav­
ings on energy and extra sav­
ings on installation. 1,000 sq. 
ft. of 6” insulation for only 
$.70. Caprock Home Center, 
455-1193, Quitaque. 2-tfc

OUR BU SIN ESS I 
IS EXHAUSTING . . . 

Custom Tailpipes for Pickups 
Cars, Tractors and Combines. 

Dual Exhaust a Specialty.
DON'S M UFFLER SHOP 

123 W. Oainornia Street 
Floydada, Texas 983-2273

WANT TO BUY USED LADIES 
Bicycle. 823-2468. 13-tfc

Cords of Thanks
We would like to express our 

deepest appreciation for all the 
kindness and love shown our 
family during our loss.

All the flowers, food, memor­
ials and cards helped so much.

A special thanks to Dr. Tuan 
and our wonderful paramedics 
and EMTs. We are very fortun­
ate to have these dedicated 
people and to live in a town 
where people care.

God bless you.
Ella Leah and Tobe 
Leona Brooks and family 
Manemma Hutsell and family 
Juanita Self and family 
Gerald Smith and family 
Glenn Smith and family

NOW OPEN
M  &  M  LAUNDROMAT

NEW MAYTAG WASHERS & DRYERS

' Your Business Appreciated

Open 7:00 a.m, to 10:00 p.m. 
Donnie & Caro! Martin, Owners

W eil M® Of The Square 
SILVERTON, TEXAS

EED PROTECTANT
FLOWABLE CONCENTRATE

It’s  profit protection 
you won’t want 
to be without.

Controls pre- and posier^ergence 
seed and seeding disease w ih  M  
powerful system ic action

Highly eHect*ve against f^Nzoctome 
so ta n r  whteH accounts tor 70 to 80% 
of an seeding .disease problems

lOhWfjtine cosily -©planting and 
f  stops *n cotton

Do yourself and your cotton 3 
favor. Order GO-BETTER OfHt 
y fT A V A X  now . . and give your 
seedsm an ample time to workv

Netos produce qwcto even 
em ergence of stands

Provides extended butít-m 
disease protection 
Provides a broad spectrurn of 
d isease control when compned 
w in  a contact tong o d e

Ohe-s a wde margin of safer/ tor 
• most prams arto an im a l

i s  compatible with other pesticides 
common*) used on or Over ÓQtton

_ V-tava^ is me only mm systemic 
\ seed treatment presently abe leo  ter 

f- *■ *“ ose on cotton

1 GO-BETTER" and VITAVAX Sy&iemîç Treated CettonsAwo pro- 
due# th iJghM f :n c r* s i?  m jï*W  P *f « û iK f spent lo 4 »y‘ -
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t o N l t h T — a GC BETTER  and VITAVAX managemem decision 
row prevents possible 100 hftto and / or too Tate treatment tmm (of 
rot a5 to during the busy otontmg schedule.
EFFEC T IV E — GO -SETTER and ViTAVAX provce systemic p-elect on 
( 2 4  h o u r s  2 6a , a g a i n s t  s e e d l i n g  d i s e a s e s  a n d  i n s e c t s  t o "  3  o r  4 
v*ee*> sber pJanNnj| T p r-v  >d vigor me»ea>ed seeding «eight B€%.
E NOW CAL — GO -BETTER ang yiTAVAX applied to your seed -s 
h ;tu a i.. e ss ©spans we t- a • the application post c o y  1 o d sprays 
for nsect ©ehirgi . the :owest cost system c seeming pr*toetton 
ava labie at only 7 cents per-acre pet-day of prelection. Only 3 pounds 
of Uni a? toda/s prices a ' pay for seed»ng pretocttofl for an errilfe: 
acre yet GO-BETTER and VITAVAX have averaged over l f%  
m ytet-dl : 1 0  to increase m y g'o ,*<;•-> cototo
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All Seed Unless Special Ordered Will Be Treated With This.
f
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