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Bogata Main Street 
U-Turns A “No-No

The Bogata City Council 
approved an ordinance Tues­
day night prohibiting U-turns at 
the north end of Main Street by 
the Methodist Church. The 
Texas Department of Public 
Safety had requested such an 
ordinance by the city in order 
that the Highway Department 
could erect a sign and the law 
could be enforced.

Mayor Clifford Barnard said 
he was one of the many guilty 
citizens who made U-tums in 
that spot, but had stopped doing 
it since he was e le c t^  Mayor 
because he couldn’t stand the 
ribbing if he got “ pinched”  for 
it. The consensus of the council 
was that the U-turn is 
dangerous, and safe driving 
should be the rule.

Councilman George Smith 
was named the secretary of the 
council by acclaimation and the 
council voted to meet Novem­
ber 29 at 7:30 p.m. in a special

session to canvass the votes of 
the special election for two city 
council posts.

Those who have filed for the 
two positions are David 
Mullins, Joe Greger, Kenneth 
Brumley, Kenneth Jeffery and 
Dr. Jack Troutt.

Smith reported to the council 
on a meeting of the Ark-Tex 
Council of Governments con­
cerning emergency medical 
services, and reported that he 
planned to attend as many 
meetings as he could.

Councilman Tommy Corbell 
told the council that something 
needs to be done soon about the 
problem of the city dump, and 
M ayor Barnard said that 
county commissioner J. N. Lee, 
and County Judge Gavin 
Watson should be contacted 
concerning a contribution to­
ward the maintenance of the 
dump by the county govern­

ment, as county residents use 
the dump.

The council approved a street 
light to be installed on North 
Bryson Street. Smith and 
Corbell said they had checked 
the area after dark and the 
area is very dark indeed.

Mayor Barnard reported that 
the new water line in the 
Smiley-Varner addition has a 
few leaks in it, and that the 
leaks need to be repaired 
before anyone ties on to the 
line. Corbell asked about the 
possibility of Lone Star Gas 
Company using old water lines 
in the area to supply some of 
the houses, and Barnard said 
he understood that there is 
some possibility that this might 
be done.

Councilman Ralph Cawley 
asked if the city could clean the 
roadsides near the “ Y ”  at the 
south end of Main Street, as the

corner is blind and dangerous. 
Mayor Barnard said he would 
have the city employees check 
on the area-

Red River Deputy Sheriff 
Jim Bob Shipp asked the 
council if  they had any 
instructions, complaints or 
duties that he might perform 
for the city, and indicated his 
willingness to do a good job.

Pet Care Topic 
At Brownie Meet

“ How To Care For Your Pet”  
was the program topic fo r , 
Brownie Troop 22 when they 
met Monday, November 10. Jo ; 
Ann Stubblefield and Rebecca ■ 
Taylor told the group about j 
their own pets and how they j 
care for them. The Brownies  ̂
enjoyed looking at books on 
pets.

Refreshements of cookies 
and Kool-Aid were served to 14 
members and two guests.

Rebels Defeated By Commerce 21-6
„    _  . . T h o  R A K u k lc  u /i11  r \ l o \ /  I
The Rivercrest Rebels were 

defeated by the Commerce 
T igers at Rebel Stadium 
Friday night 21 to 6, in a game 
in which the Rebels passing 
yardage outdistanced the yards 
gained on the ground.

The Rebels connected five 
times for 90 yards, with most of 
the yardage gained on a pass 
from quarterback Larry Taylor 
to Kenny Stanley for 55 yards in 
the fourth quarter.

The workhorse for the Rebels 
against Commerce was Sammy 
Ellis, who carried 16 times for 
45 yards, and scored the Rebel 
touchdown late in the fourth 
quarter from the eight yard 
line.

The Tigers had the first 
possession of the ballgame, and 
the Rebels forced them to punt 
from their own 46 yard line. The 
punt was returned 26 yards by 
Gary Neill, and it was Neill who 
gained the Rebel first down 
with a nine and seven yard run. 
Neill lost the ball on a fumble to 
the Tigers two plays later, but 
the Rebel defense forced

BASKETBALL SCHEDULE
Varsity

November 15, Malakoff, A- 
G irls, at Commerce, 1:00, 
There.

November 21, Malakoff, A- 
Girls, 6:00, There.

November 22, Detroit, A- 
Boys and Girls, Nineth Grade 
Boys, 5:00, Here.

November 25, Detroit, A- 
Boys and Girls, Nineth Grade 
Boys, 5:00, There.

Junior Varsity
November 20 - 22, North 

Hopkins Tourney, Boys and 
Girls.

another punt from the Tigers. 
Neill intercepted a Tiger pass 
on their next possession, but 
neither team managed to score 
in the first period.

The first Commerce score 
came in the middle of the

second quarter, when Tiger 
quarterback Wade Wilson, a 
junior, made a 12 yard run 
around the right end, and Tiger 
back Fred Washington, also a 
junior, carried the ball in from 
the 15 yard line.

The Commerce passing game 
accounted for the next score, 
with Wilson connecting with 
John Foster for a 31 yard play 
followed by a touchdown pass 
of 15 yards to John Clark.

With the first possession after

Bankers, Ag Producers 
To Meet In Big Sandy

halftim e, the Rebels put 
together a 37 yard drive, but 
fell short of a first down at­
tempt by four yards. The 
T igers turned their next 
possession into their final 
touchdown.

The 55 yard pass from Taylor 
to Stanley set up the Rebel 
score on a drive that began on 
the Rivercrest nine yard line. 
Gary Neill caught a nine yard 
pass, Stanley caught an 11 yard 
pass, and Ellis made eight 
yards on the ground for the 
Rebel score.

The Rebels will play Rains 
there Friday night at 7:30 p.m.
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STATISTICS 
First Downs 

Yds. Rushing 
Pass Attempts 

Pass Comp. 
Pass Yds. 

Pass Int. By 
Kickoffs

C 
17 
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14 
5 

78 
1

4avg. 45
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Punts 3 for 124 
Penalties 2 for 20 
Fumbles 3

A program for both agri­
cultural producers and lending 
institutions which make agri- 
cuUural loans is scheduled 
November 20, 1975, according 
to Bob Moody, County Extens- 
sion Agent. Sponsored by Area 
III of the Build East Texas 
organization and the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, the program, “ Financ­
ing Northeast Texas Agri­
culture” , begins with registra­
tion at 9:15 a m. in the Science 
Lecture Hall on the campus of 
Ambassador College near Big 
Sandy.

County Extension Agents in 
Upshur, Gregg, Harrison and 
Marion Counties have complete 
details on the program. These 
counties comprise BET Area 
III and are jointly sponsoring 
the event.

According to Moody, the 
meeting is designed to inform 
producers and financial insti­
tutions of re la tive ly  new 
agricultural practices and 
some of the practices that are 
no longer profitable. Those 
attending will be welcomed by 
Upshur County Judge Everett 
Dean. Dr. Daniel Pfannstiel, 
associate director of the Texas

STUDENTS OF THE 
MONTH—Valerie Black- 
bum, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Valgene Blackburn and 
M ir y  Taylor, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. L. P. Taylor, were 
selected Students o f the 
Month for Novem ber at 
Rivercrest High School. Miss 
Blackburn is a member of

Future Teachers, FHA, 
National Honor Society and 
the Spanish Club. She is 
secretary of the senior class, 
a cheerleader and was 
Homecoming Queen. Taylor 
is a member of the River­
crest newpaper staff. FFA, 
and plays football, 
baaketball, baseball and 
tennis. (Staff Photo)

Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, will discuss “ Texas 
Agriculture in the Future” . He 
will relate some of the forces 
which are expected to affect 
both production and marketing 
of agricultural products.

“ World Outlook and Eco­
nomic Situation as it Affects the 
Beef Industry”  is the topic of 
Dr. Ernest Davis, Extension 
livestock marketing specialist. 
College Station. Davis is 
becoming well know for his 
analysis of beef cattle markets 
and the factors affecting those 
markets.Cattlemen throughout 
East Texas have been in a 
cost-price squeeze for the past 
two years. The world beef and 
grain market continues to play 
a major role in this situtation.

Ben Black, vice president, 
Red River National Bank, 
Clarksville, Texas, is scheduled 
to tell the group how “ A Banker 
Looks at his Agricu ltural 
Loans” . Black will emphasize 
the record and financial 
analysis needs for obtaining 
credit or makin loans. Pro­
ducers could make better 
management decisions and 
bankers could make sounder 
loans if adequate records were 
available. He will also discuss 
sources of technical infor­
mation for lenders.

“ Managing Agricultural Re­
sources Through Estate Plan­
ning”  is the subject of Bob 
Walsh, trust officer for the 
First National Bank of Fort 
Worth. His discussion of the 
problems and expenses of 
transferring agricultural hold­
ings to heirs will include how to 
make the transfers and full 
utilize the property at the same 
time.

“ Forage Finished Beef Pro­
duction and Marketing” , a 
subject widely discussed 
among beef producers, will be 
examined by Dr. John

Bazaar Scheduled 
November 15

First United Methodist 
Church in Bogata has sched­
uled a bazaar for November 15, 
beginning at 9:00 a m. to 6:30 
p.m. Items to be offered for 
sale will include aprons and 
Bicentennial bonnets, baked 
goods, homemade CTiristmas 
decorations, pillows, quilts, 
afghans, ceramics, paintings 
and sketches, decoupage, cro­
chet, crewel, needlepoint and 
embroidery, artificial flower 
arrangements, plus potted 
plants and hanging baskets.

An excellent noon meal will 
be served in the church 
basement on the bazaar day. 
All monies raised through this 
bazaar will be used to reduce 
the Bogata church building 
debt.

Carpenter, superintendent. 
West Louisiana Experiment 
Station, Rosepine, Louisiana.

A special program is planned 
for ladies attending. It includes 
a tour of the campus, home 
economics department and food 
service facilities. The ladies 
program begins at 9:55 a.m.

After a question and answer 
session, the meeting will end at 
approximately 3:00 p.m. Lunch 
will be available at a nominal 
cost. The meeting is free and 
open to all interested persons.

Talco Book Club 
Meets With Mrs. 
Cleone Sullivan

The Talco Book Club mem­
bers drove to Bogata Friday to 
meet in the home of Mrs. 
Cleone Sullivan for a meeting 
on “ Good Manners.”  Mrs. A. E. 
Foster opened the meeting in 
the absence of the president, 
Mrs. J. H. Weatherall. Mrs. J. 
L. Cato led the club prayer.

During the business session, 
Mrs. T. L. Barton gave a report 
on funds in the club’s project, 
the CMty Cemetery, and it was 
voted to draw names for 
Christmas gifts this year. 
Seven members answered roll 
call with a thought for good 
manners.

After exchanging books, Mrs. 
Barton presented a most in- 
fwmative program on “ Good 
Manners”  of which the most 
important one is consideration 
for others. Very clever quiz 
games were enjoyed with Mrs. 
Sullivan and Mrs. Ollie Jones 
winning prizes.

Assisted by Mrs. Barton, the 
hostess served a refreshment 
plate, carrying out the 
Thanksgiving theme. Those 
present were Mrs. Ollie Jones, 
Mrs. J. L. Cato, Mrs. A. E. 
Foster, Mrs. Tom Barthel, Mrs. 
Ivy Smith, Mrs. 0. B. Hopwood, 
Mrs. Barton and the hostess, 
Mrs. Sullivan.

'The next meeting will be 
November 21 in the home of 
Mrs. Hopwood when Mrs. 
Barthel will present a program 
on a woman of the Bible, Queen 
Elsther.

Country
Newspaperin'

A set of false teeth was left at 
Bogie’s Cafe in Bogata early 
this week, and Mrs. Bogie said 
she thought someone would 
have missed them by now, but 
apparently not. He who would 
forget his false teeth might also 
forget where he was when he 
forgot them.

A female supervisor for Wolff 
Manufacturing Manufacturing 
Company, which will open in 
Bogata December 1, is looking 
for an apartment in Bogata for 
three weeks. Anyone who might 
have a place available on a 
short term basis should contact 
The Bogata News or Mrs. Bill 
Pirtle.

SMUSH—Randy Nolen and 
Gary Neill stop a Commerce 
Tiger bali carrier in com­
petition Friday night at 
Rebel Stadium. Coming up to 
assist are Randy Belcher 
and Donald Jean. (Staff 
Photo)

Baptist Women 
Have Royal Service

Mrs. Jess Cothem led the 
Royal Service program on 
Com m unication Center: 
Philipines, Monday when the 
Baptist women of the First 
Baptist Church met. She also 
read the Prayer Calender and 
the ten members present 
assisted with the program.

A quilt was put in the frames 
after the meeting to be quilted 
Tuesday.

Talco-Bogata Schools To Have 
In-Service On Nov. 17

SW EE TH EART — Cora 
Greger, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Greger of Bogata, 
was named Band Sweetheart 
during halftime ceremonies 
at the R ivercrest, Com­
merce football game Friday

night. She was given a 
bouquet of roses by first 
trumpet player Tony Har- 
bison, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Harbison of Bogata. 
(Staff Photo)

Teachers in the Talco-Bogata 
Schools will have an inservice- 
workday on Monday, 
November 17th. Students will 
not attend school on this day. 
All teachers in grades four 
through twelve will meet at 
Rivercrest at 8:30 a.m. for a 
presentation and discussion on 
contract teaching that is to be 
made by Gretchen King, a 
teacher in the Daingerfield 
Schools. Mrs. King has made 
presentations on this topic at 
various professional meetings 
and is considered to be very 
knowledgeable in the area of 
contract teaching.

Teachers in grades kin­
dergarten through third from 
Talco and Bogata along with 
some teacher aides, music and 
art teachers, will visit in the 
Mount Vernon Elementary 
Schools on Monday morning of 
the in-service day. These 
teachers will observe teaching 
techniques, procedures, and 
practices in the Mount Vernon 
Schools that have been suc­
cessful and effective with the 
idea of gaining information to

implement in their own 
teaching.

All teachers will return to 
their respective campuses for a 
work session on Monday af­
ternoon. Friday, November 
14th will end the first Quarter of 
the school year as well as the 
second reporting period and 
teachers will use the afternoon 
in grading test papers, 
preparing report cards to issue 
to students, and other work.

Parents are reminded that 
school will dismiss on Wed­
nesday, November 26th at 2:30 
p.m. for the Thanksgiving 
Holidays and will resume on 
Monday, December 1. Also, 
school is to be dismissed for the 
Christmas Holidays at 2:30 
p.m. on Friday, December 19th 
and will resume on Monday, 
January 5th.

Take The Truck
Homeowner on phone: 

“ Come quickly! Our house 
is on fire.”

Fireman: “ How do we get 
there?”

Homeowner: “ Can’t you 
use the red truck?"

Editor’s Quote Book
The earnestness of 

your desire will in­
dicate the distance you 
are likely to travel.

Clark C. Stockford

William Smith In 
NATO  Exercises

A L A M O G O R D O , N ew  
Mexico—Airman William K. 
Smith, son of Mr. and Mrs. H. 
W. Smith of 544 Patterson, 
Bogata, recently took part in 
“ C rest^  Cap 75,”  a North 
Atlantic Treaty Organization 
(NATO) training exercise in 
Germany.

Airman Smith is an ad­
m inistrative specialist at 
Holloman AFB, New Mexico, 
with the dual tosed 49th Tac­
tical Fighter Wing whose units 
deployed to the European 
continent for the month-long 
maneuvers.

F ly ing non-stop from 
Holloman, 96 NA’TO-committed 
F-4 Phantom fighter-bombers 
were refueled en route by 
Strategic Air (Command KC-135 
Stratotankers. A ir lift  of 
maintenance and support 
specialists was provided by 
Military Airlift Command C-130 
Hercules and C-141 Starlifter 
aircraft.

The exercise was designed to 
maintain aircrew proficiency 
in instrument flying and radar 
bombing in support of allied 
forces in Europe.

Airman Smith is a 1974 
graduate of Rivercrest High 
School.

i

BOILER—Lee Owens and 
his son, Roger, complete 
Installation of a boiler for use 
in the pressing section of the 
W o lf f  M a n u fa c tu r in g

Company plant in Bogata, 
Owens, the maintenance 
supervisor for W olff, is 
spending long days and 
evenings preparing the

Assembly of God Church 
building on Fifth Street in 
Bogata for opening on 
December 1, 1975, (Staff 
Photo)
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SAVK—Sammy Flllis han^s 
on and Bill Montgomery 
comes up to assist a Com­

merce Tiger runner on a 
sideline run against the 
Rebels as the reserves watch

from the sidelines. The 
Tigers beat the Rebels 21-6. 
(Staff Photo)

73 Buick LeSabre I  7 5  Wiliys Jeep
4 DOOR. A L L  EXT RAS , 

CLEA N,
GOOD RUBBER,

A L O T O F  CAR 
FOR T H E  M O N E Y

7 4  Ambassador
4 DOOR. POWER BRAKES. 

POWER  S T E E R IN G . 
AIR CO NDITI ONIN G. 

A U T O  TRANSMISSION, 
RADIO, 3S.OOO MILES. 

R EAL NICE

72 Honda 350

A R E A L  BARGAIN

4 W H E E L  DRIVE, 
R OLL  BARS. 

HUBS.
I 7 M A C T U A L M I L E S  

L IK E  NEW

W E N E E D  

G O O D  

U S ED  

C A R S  A  
T R U C K S

7 3  Ford F-100 

Custom
POWER S T E E R IN G . 

RADIO.
A U TO TR A N SM IS S IO N . 

T H E  BARGAIN  
OF T H E  W E E K !

7 3  CMC 
Sierra Grande
AIR CO NDITIONING.  
POWER STEER IN G . 

A U TO  TRANSMISSION. 
R E A L  NICE

7 4  Ford F-100 

Ranger XLT

71 Mercury 
Marguis 

Brougham
4 DOOR.

AL L EXTRAS, 
L O W M IL E A G E  

C LE A N

I.NJURED—Eugene Nor­
man. number 89, injured his 
ankle in this play Friday 
night, but the injury was not 
considered serious. Randy 
Nolen, number 63, is in the 
background. (Staff Photo)

Tolco-Bogota 
School News

By Cathy Jones 
and Terri Hanna

This week marks the « id  of 
the first quarter with quarter 
exams being given on Thursday 
and Friday, November 13 and 
14.

The Rivercrest FHA were 
host at a Pioneer Breakfast for 
Rivercrest teachers on Mon­
day, November 10. Monday will 
be a Teacher In Service Day. 
Classes will be dismissed tor 
the day but w ill resume 
Tuesday.

The Rebelettes played in the 
district volleyball tournament 
in Quitman this week.

Basketball season will get 
under way November 15, when 
the Rebelettes travel to 
Commerce for the ETSU 
Basketball Clinic. They will 
play Malakoff at 2:30. The first 
boys game w ill be held 
November 22, against Detroit. 
It will be a home game. The 
junior varsities begin play on 
November 20, in the North 
Hopkins tournament. Season 
tickets will be available at the 
principal’s office.

Students of the month for 
November were selected by the 
Student Council. They are 
Valerie Blackburn and Larry 
Taylor. The Student Council 
will also be in charge of Fresh­
men Day to be held November 
2 1 .

The last Rebel football game 
will be held at Rains this 
Friday. Kick-off time is 7:30 
p.m.

Harvest Festival 
At Cunningham

A Harvest Festival will be 
held at the Cunningham 
Community Center Saturday, 
November 15, 1975.

The food booth will open at 
6:00 p.m., games will be played 
beginning at 7:00 p.m. and 
Bingo will begin at 7:30 p.m.

A ll proceeds from this 
project will be used toward the 
maintenance of the Community 
Center.

Everyone is urged to come 
and support his project, and 
join in the community 
fellowship.

HOUSE OF FLOW ERS— 
Now open in Bogata and 
celebrating with a Grand 
Opening this Friday and 
Saturday is the Bogata 
House of Flowers. The 
business, located in the 
building formerly occupied 
by Mankins Grocery on Main 
Street in Bogata, has fresh 
and artificial flowers, plants, 
corsages and arrangements 
for Thanksgiving. (S ta ff 
Photo)

Traffic Safety Office Provided

WHERE NO ONE WALKS AWAY

Donnie Keck Ford, Inc.
Ferguson Road Phone 572-3486

M t. Pleasant, Texas

COMMERCE—Thanks to a 
special new program provided 
by East Texas State Univer­
sity, driving in this part of the 
state may become a little safer.

Since the beginning of Sep­
tember, Glenn Wagner has 
logged several thousand miles 
visiting elected officials in 15 
North Texas counties and 
consulting with them about 
saving lives on their streets and 
highways.

Wagner, 33, a veteran police 
officer and also an educator, is 
director of ETSU’s Traffic 
Safety Office (TSO). He ex­

plained that his primary 
purpose is to assist small 
municipalities and county 
governments in the 15-county 
region around Commerce 
obtain state and federal grants* 
for improving traffic safety.

“ The office is funded by the 
State of Texas,”  Wagner said, 
“ to provide these smaller, non­
metro communities with a 
service they couldn’t otherwise 
afford and to help them solve 
some of the problems which 
growth brings.”

Specific examples of this aid 
include: Traffic engineering

Impress 
yourself 

while you 
express 

yourself.
Why not treat yourself right.
When you’ve got something pleasant to 

say.say iton a phone that's a pleasure to use. 
The Styleline extension telephone.

It's our newest model and it shows it. 
It’s upto date,feels right and 

looks great.
To make it easier to use, 
we’ve put the dial in the 
handset so it ’s always at 

your fingertip.
And, there’s even a recall 
button beneath the dial 
soyou don’t have to hang 
up to hang up.

It’s so handy calling’s 
a breeze.

And who knows, using the 
mod Styleline telephone may 

impress you enough to help 
you impress others more.

GERERAL TELEPHORE
Styleline* Extensions

surveys; training police 
reservists; defensive driving 
schools; and obtaining money 
for painting highway stripes, 
railroad crossing warnings and 
other road improvements.

“ The TSO philosophy is to 
simply help in any area of 
traffic safety that we can,” 
Wagner noted. “ I even spend a 
lot of time keeping my eyes 
open for problem areas which I 
relay to o fficia ls in that 
locality.”

A recent accomplishment of 
the office took place near Lake 
Lavon in Collin County, where a 
tremendous housing expansion 
was responsible for 
overloading roads. Govern­
ment officials in the county 
couldn’t afford to do much 
about the situation until 
Wagner helped them get a 
$40,000 federal grant to hire 
some police officers for the 
area.

“ Larger cities can afford to 
hire people knowledgeable 
about governmental grant 
processes,”  he said. “ But of­
ficials in the smaller places 
many times are not even aware 
of the help available to them, 
much less how to go about 
getting the money.”

Wagner, a native of Emblem, 
holds both bachelor and 
masters degrees from ETSU 
and is also a law enforcement 
instructor here. He has worked 
with the Texas Highway 
Department and is a former 
Sulphur Springs police officer.

The office here is sponsored 
by ETSU’s Division of Con­
tinuing Education.

Counties served are Hunt, 
Rockwall, Grayson, Fannin, 
Delta, Lamar, Hopkins, 
Franklin, Titus, Morris, Camp, 
Red River, Bowie, Collin and 
Rains.

Girl Scout Dinner 
Meeting Set

The Red River Valley Girl 
Scout Council will hold it’s 
Annual Dinner Meeting on 
November 18,1975, at 7:00 p.m. 
at the First Christian Church in 
Paris, Texas. The program will 
include a slide presentation by 
the senior girls who visited 
“ Our Cabana” , a Girl Scout 
International Center in Mexico 
this summer, a report on the 
recent Girl Scout National 
Council Meeting in Washington 
D. C. by Mrs. Dwight Woolston, 
and a presentation of awards. 
Dr. Don Smith, Council 
President, announced that this 
is the 20th Anniversary of the 
founding of the Red River 
Valley Girl Scout Council, a 
United Fund Agency

The Veterans Administration 
will process 62 million compen­
sation and pension checks this 
year.

C R U N C H — The pickup 
driven by Red River deputy 
Jim Bob .Shipp of Bogata 
c o l l i d e d  T h u r s d a v ,

Novembers, with a 1968 GTO 
driven by Robert Beaty of 
Clarksville on Highway 271

near Tip Top Drive In. 
Damage to both vehicles was 
extensive. (Staff Photo)

Twenty-Six Attend Circle 8 Communicators Meeting
The Circle Eight Com­

municators C B Club was called 
to order by the president. 
Sparky, with approximately 26 
meml^rs and visitors present. 
The Club voted to have two 
meetings a month on the first 
and third Monday nights of 
each month, and to have these 
meetings at the Hagansport 
Center each time.

It was reported that the ticket 
sells for the CB Radio are going 
well and the drawing will be at 
Hagansport Friday, November 
21 at 7:30p.m. All are invited to 
be there for the drawing. You 
do not have to be present to win 
this radio.

The door prize went to 
Buckshot, an external speaker 
for a radio was the prize.

Everyone was in favor of 
having a Christmas party on 
December 15 at 7:30 p.m. All 
members are urged to attend 
this party. Everyone is to bring 
either a mans, ladies or childs

gift to be exchanged, price not 
to exceed $2.25 . Committees 
were appointed for refresh­
ment, decorating and en­
tertainment. Those on the 
committies are Buckshot, 
Camelot, Nanny, Honey Bee, 
Tankers Lady, Falcon, and 
Sparky. Sparky thanked those 
who helped with the fish fry and 
made it a success.

After the meeting closed 
there was a transmitting

treasure hunt. Those doing the 
hiding were Red Barron, Hot 
Rod and Rifleman. Those 
finding the treasure were 
Buckshot, Buckwheat and 
Little Diamond. There were 
two new members that joined 
making a total of 99 members 
now.

The next meeting will be at 
Hagansport Center on Monday, 
December 1, at 7:30 p.m.
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Entered as Second Class Matter at the Post Office at 
Deport, Texas.
Robert W. Wright Publisher and Advertising Manager 
Pat Wright Editor
Mrs. Wayman Alexander News

SUBSCRIPTION PRICE
$5.(M) A. Year For Titus, Franklin, Red River And Lamar 

Counties
$7.(Ml Out Of County. Oversea, $8..50.

J J j  E] S  ® ^  S  1
Prices Good Thurs., Fri., Sat., Nov. 13,14 & 15

OPEN
S U N D A Y
1:00 To 5:00 p.m.

FUTURE

FLO OR FINISH
TONITO'S-13 0Z .

P IZ Z A
R ED H EA R T

D O G  FO O D 2 ^ 3 7 ' ASSORTED A O C  
FLAVORS W J J

Kraft Je t Puff Marshmallows 'Z 39‘
MEADOW GOLD LADY SCOT 200 COUNT

M ILK Fa c ia l T is s u e  5 5 ‘
KRAFT 32 OZ. JAR

M ira c le  W hip 99^
BAMA

Apple Grape Jelly
18OZ. TUM BLER

69'

FOOD STAMPS I 
ARE

W ELCOME HERE

H OTBARBEQUETO GO

PYLANT GROCERY AND 
MARKET
Talco, Texas



Kenny Stanley
Outstanding Lineman

Jimmy Forsyth
Outstanding Back

Come To The Game Friday Night

There 7:30 p.m.

Rivercrest vs. Rains
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REBEL VARSITY
I

The Sponsors O t This Page Proudly P resent The O u ts tan d in g  

Linem an A n d  O u ts tan d in g  Back O t The W e e k
Selected By the Rebel Coaching Staff
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Jordan Feed 
And Ranch Supply

Bogata

Waddell’s Grocery
Talco

Ward Auto Parts
Boftata

Tidwell TV And Appliance
Bogata and Deport

Bogata Paint 
And Body Shop

Bogata

B&B Furniture 
And Hardware

Talco

Tip Top Drive In
Bogata

271 Texaco
Bogata

Talco Well Service
Talco

Mike Bell Air Conditioning
Bogata

Joe Ford Grocery
Bogata

Denny Skating Rink 
And Garage

Bogata

Annie Lee’s Gift Shop
Bogata

Skaggs Garage 

And Magic Fashion
Bogata

First National Bank
Bogata

Turner’s Dry Goods
Bogata

Gibson’s TV And CB Radios
Bogata

Lassiter Hardware
Bogata

Talco State Bank 

And Jones Insurance
Talco

Johntown Grocery
Johntown

271 Conoco
And Nina’s Beauty Shop

Bogata

Industrial Transport, Inc.
Richard and Jerry Stansell

Hamilton Laundry
Bogata

Handley Exxon
Talco

The Bogata News And 

The Talco Times
Bob & Pat Wright

Bogata Furniture
Joe and Evelyn

Simmons General Contractors
Talco

Discount Auto Sales
Bogata

Frank Sloan 
Insurance Agency

Talco

Talco Self Service 
And Auto Accessories

Talco

Kisner’s Grocery
Bogata

';1

:

•hi
‘>•5 Jn

■<si

■ 1 t*

i f

i'rtfy 7''



Thursday, November 13, 1975

S I M M S - M O O R f  LUM BER & HARDW ARE
Building Material Mart

FREE!
Speciol! 

Window Glass 
Cut To Size

O N E OF BILLIE TID W ELLS

A FR IC A N  V IO LET PLANTS
WITH EACH PURCHASE O F <15.00 O R M ORE 

OF H O H -S A U  ITEMS

FIVE Q U A R T
P A IN T  POTS

4 “  P A IN T BRUSH FREE
With Purchase of 5 Gallons Or More

O LYM P IC
O V ER C O A T $ 9 12

Sale-Save On
Paneling
While Supply Lasts! 

Limited To Stock On Hand 
Pre-Finished ■ Good Quality

i h s u l a t e  

^  PIPES.

WHITE STEEL

SINKS
21"X 32" Reg. $22.98 

Less Trim

. PREVENT FREEZING 
IN BRIEF COLD SNAPS 
1 u s e

FIBER GLASS 
INSULATION

Challenger Hand Saw
8 Point - Reg. $4.98 $988

COM PUTE PLUM BING SUPPLIES
HWY. 27t-BOGATA PHONE 632-SM1

A LL SALES G U AR AN TEED
C O N V ^ IE N T  YARD HOURS 

OPEN MON.-%AT. 7:00 A.M. T O 5:00 P.M. 
CASHANDCARRY

We Reserve The Right To Limit Quantities

P u b lic  Notice
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

To: Walter Neal Patterson
GREETING:

You are commanded to appear by filing 
a written answer to the Petitioner's 
petition at or before 10 o’clock A. M. of the 
first Monday after the expiration of 42 
days from the date of issuance of this 
Citation, the same being Monday the 22nd 
day of December, A. D.. 1975. at or before 
10 o’clock A. M.. before the Hwiorable 
02nd Court of Lamar County, at the Court 
House in Paris. Texas. Said Petitioner’s 
petition was filed on the 3rd day of 
November. 1975. The file number of said 
suit being No. 41974. I^ e  names the 
parties in said suit are: Maudie Mae 
Patterson as Petitioner, and Walter Neal 
Patterson as Respondent.

The nature of said suit being sub­
stantially as follows, to wit: Petitioner 
sues for divorce stat Ing the marriage has 
become insupportable because of discord 
or conflict of personalities between 
Petitioner and Respondent that destroys 
the legitimate ends of the marriage 
relationship and prevents any reasonaMe 
expectation of reconclliatiim.

If this Citation is not served within 99 
days after the date of its issuance. It shall 
be returned unserved. Issued this the 3rd 
day of November A. D.. 1975.

Myra Nell Wilson. Clerk.
District Court.
Lam ar County, Texas

NOTICE
...\n ordinance passed by the 
Rogata City Council November 
II and effective at time of 
erection of a sign so stating 
makes illegal a U-turn at the 
corner of Main Street and 
Second street. Penalty for 
violation will be according to 
the laws of The State of Texas.

CHAIN
SAWS

$ 1399$ Up

Heavy Duty

EXION SURE TIE
Baler Twine
$2000 A

Bundle

GLASS
IM P L E M E N T  CO.

2155 N. Main P»'’l» 784-7429

RED GRAVEL hauled from 
our pit in Oklahoma. White 
rock also available. Jordan’s 
Feed & Ranch Supply in 
B o g a ta . 632-4134.

FLOW ERS for weddings, 
special occasions, funerals 

and no reason at all. Call Carol 
Jordan, now representing 
Jones Florist, Clarksville, at 
632-4134, Bogata.

WANTED TO BUY — Old guns, 
coins, antiques. Call Shep­

pard’s Grocery, 632-5496, 
Hagansport.

FOR SALE — Perfwmance 
tested Red Angus bulls, 9 to 

20 months. Fred Landry, 
Garksville, Texas.

BUDDY’S MENS WEAR — 
Home of quality m er­

chandise, 130 Main Street, 
(db-tfc)

BOBBY DICKEY back hoe, 
plumbing, sewer service, 

septic tanks and field lines 
installed and repaired. Call 632- 
4170, Bogata.

WANTED TO BUY — Mobile 
home. 1, 2 or 3 bedrooms, 

furnished or unfurnished. Up to 
$4,000. Hammond Mobile 
Homes, Sulphur Springs, Texas 
885-7054.

WANT TO BUY a disc with 3- 
point hookup. Fred Allen, 652- 

3148, Deport.

FOR SALE—Remington 304)6 
Model DDL with 3x9 Verb 

scope. Priced to sell. 632-5314.

FOR SALE—Camper trailer 66 
Outdoorsman, sleeps 5, phone 

652-4891, If no answer call 
652-3925.

TEXAS REFINERY CORP.
offers PLEN TY OF MONEY 

plus cash bonuses, fringe 
benefits to mature individual in 
Deport, Bogata, Talco area. 
Regardless of experience, 
airmail A. R. Pate, Pres., 
Texas Refinery Corp., Box 711, 
Fort Worth, Texas 76101.

BEAUTY SHOP for rent in 
Downtown Deport. Complete 

with three full stations. Ready 
to open for business. Call 652- 
4205 or 652-2590.

LINOLEUM priced at |1 a 
yard. Where else but B&B 

Furniture In Tako.

LUM BER C O M P A N Y

FOR YOUR LUMBER  
AND

B U ILD IN G  NEEDS

201 S. Walnut 
Phone 427-3095 

CLARKSVILLE

W AN T  ADS

BINGO
EVERY 

TUESDAY 
NIGHT 

7:30 p.in. 
Deport Americon 

Legion H a l
Air Conditioned

USED REFRIG E RATO RS 
FOR Sa l e  — All sizes, ready 

to deliver. Bell Air Conditioning 
in Bogata, 632-5321.

BUCK'S
Rolling Homes, Inc.

East Ttxas Bast Salactlon 
Of Quality Moblla Homas

U YaarF H A B  Bank 
Financing

Ont Year Warranty WItli 
All Naw Homas. S lit And 
Otcor To Plaasa Every 

Naad.

“ Drive A Little 
Sava A Lot"

BONDED

Phone S7]-S4St 
204 Ferguson Road 

Mt. Pleasant 
Across From Donnie 

Keck Ford

Special Of The Weak

See Our
Beautiful Double-Wide 

On Display

Let's Deal
Camplataly Furnished

SUPER

T IR E
SALE

DELTA TIRES
Limited Supply—
While They Last!

$ocooReg. $41.18

700-15-M.S. 
Reg. $59.78

470-15 
Reg. $54.48

E78-14 
Reg. $43.00

$33«»
$28“
$ 2 9 * 0

G78-14 
Reg. $55.34

G78-K 
Reg. $45.49

AN Prices 
Plus 5 Percent 

Sa lesTax

$35< 
$30“
$ 2 7 0 0

271 TEXACO
Highway 271, Bogata 432-4433

FLOWERS for all occasions.
Call Mrs. Gordon Allen, 

Representative, Clarksville 
Florists. (tfc)

OIS SWAIM 
REAL ESTATE

Let Us List Your Property

Form Home
Basinets Ranch

Bogata Talco
432-5424 379-3731

Bedford- Redfearn

H OSPITAL BEDS, W HEEL 
CHAIRS, walkers, complete 

line of hospital equipment for 
home care of patient. Hospital 
Equipment Rental & Supplies, 
Mt. Vernon, Texas. M ^icare 
approved. 537-4146 or 537-2942. 
Mrs. Fred Barker, Manager.

FOR SALE-Ph ilco electric 
range, Call 652-2590 after 5:00 

p.m'

FOR SALE—Two Bedroom 
House On Mount Vernon 

Drive. Call 632-5866, Bogata.

CUSTOM hay baling and 
hauling. Also will buy hay 

standing. Call Blossom, 982- 
5907.

FOR SALE—2 bedroom, large 
den, 2 baths, living room 

carpeted, central heat & air, 
carport, storage, all newly 
decorated inside & out. Utility 
room, large kitchen & dining 
area, 330 2nd SW, 632-5710, 
Bogata, $18,000.

NEED BABYSITTER for small 
infant 5 days a week in my 

home or yours. Contact Lillian 
Taylor at 632-5972, Bogata, Job 
starts Nov. 24.

B U ILD IN G  PLANS 

Drafting And Blue Prints

Residential Or 
Commercial

FHA-VA-And
CONVENTIONAL

EDWIN SUGGS
215 31st. SW 
Paris, Texas 

Phone 785-3285

FOR SALE—Solid State 21” 
console RCA color TV. Gas 

driven welder and power plant 
on wheels, used ttû ee times, 
632-4443, Bogata.

HOUSE PLANTS  for sale 
starting Friday, November 

21, first house on left past 
Waddell’s Grocery on Hwy. 71 
east, Talco, 379-6121.

FOR SALE—New Scotchgard 
Early American couch, 632- 

5774, Bogata.

FOR YOUR PLUMBING and 
back hoe needs call 632-5185, 

W. T. Dodd, Bogata.

CARD OF THANKS 
We want to express our 

thanks to everywie for their 
kind expressions of sympathy 
in flowers, food, and com­
forting words and prayer in the 
tragic loss of our loved one. The 
Family of Grady Eudy.

CARD OF THANKS 
Our sincere thanks to each of 

you that helped in any way 
during the illness and death of 
our loved one. Special thanks to 
Bro. Pirtle, Mrs. Horwood, the 
singers, pallbearers and to all 
for the bountiful food, the 
beautiful flowers, to Mrs. Ludie 
Oark, Dr. Brooks and hospital 
staff, Bogata Funeral Home for 
their wonderful service. May 
God’s blessings be with each of 
you. The Family of Mrs. Doncie 
Pettit.

CARD OF THANKS 
Thanks to all who helped 

make the Pink and Blue Shower 
for Mrs. Inez Emilia Quezada a 
success. The Hostesses-

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to thank all our 

friends and relatives for the 
lovely gifts, cards, and visits so 
thou^tfully given to us at our 
50th wedding anniversary 
celebration. Our most sincere 
appreciation is extended to all 
those involved in helping make 
our 50th anniversary a special 
day in our lives. Herman and 
Jessie Belcher.

DISC0UI4T A U T O  SALES
1972 Chevrolet Monte Carlo .

$800 Down, $30 per week 9 2 8 9 5

1972 Buick Estate Wagon
$700 Down, $30 per w e e k _ . _ _ . — _ .$ 2 6 9 5

1971 Ford Galaxie 500
$400 Down, $30 per week 4 9 5

1970 Cadillac DeVille t n n t% c
$700 Down, $30 per week — _ < 9 2 0 9 5

1949 Plymouth Station Wagon ^
$300 Down, $25 per w e e k . — — 8 9 5

1949 Cadillac Coupe DeVille 
$500 Down, $30 per week . . « 9 1 6 9 5

THE FOLLOWING CARS ARE AVAILABLE FOR 
$195 DOWN A N D $20 PER W EEK

1944 Pontiac Station W agon__$595  
1944 Chevy II 2 - D o o r $595 

1944 Chevy Nova 4-O oo r_ .__ .$s9s

We Tote The Note
Open 9:00 a.m. To 7:00 p.m. 

__________________ Hwy. 37 A 271, Bogata

p  Q  p  |P  Come In And Register For

r K C C  Men's Centennial Watch
To Be Given Away Dec. 20th 8 Ladies Watch 

No Purchase Necessary, You Do Not Have To Be Present 
To Win

G« 52.9 53.9 54.9
Talco Self Service Station

Auto Accessories—Groceries 
4:00 A.M. To 7:00 P.M. Sunday 1:00 To 5:00

HEATING

AIR  CONDITIONING  

R EFR IG E R A TIO N S  
APPLIANCES  

CALL

C. L . KEITH
432-4443 Bogata 

All Work Guaranteed

The Veterans Administra­
tion’s National Cemetery Sys­
tem consists of 103 cemeteries. 
Plans call for four new 
cemeteries in fiscal year 1976.

FOR SALE — Philco Electric 
range in good condition. 

Call Deport Times, 652-
4205.

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of James L. 

Howard wishes to express their 
thanks to friends for the kind­
ness and sympathy shown in 
our time of sorrow.

271 Snack Shop 
Hot Lunches
7 Days A Week 
Mexican Foods 

All Kinds
Steaks

Sirloin $4'00

Children's Plates $1.45 
Open

Weekdays 4:00 a.m. 
To9:00 p.m.

Sunday 7:00 a.m . 
To3:00 p.m.

379-5411 Talco

NOTICE!
NO TRESPASSING  

As Of This Date 
November 10,1975 
There Will Be No 

Hunting Or Fishing 
On The Burt Grant 

Or Sid Grant Property, 
South Of Deport. 

Signed:
A. G. Pendleton, Lessee 

Sid Grant-Owner 
Eugene Sullivan-Owner

Karo

m i Z J M o E l l
P i n e  f o o d  v a l u e s

Shop A t  Dean Word Grocery This Weekend And Save On Advertised Speciolsl

c R . C . &  7 “'
FOR SALE—Selling out, taking 

bids on about 20 cows, 632- 
5141, Bogata.

NEW SINGER Zig Zag Sewing 
Machines in beautiful 

cabinets, $159.50. Also good 
reconditioned trade-ins, $19.50 
and up. See them at Kirby 
Company, across the street 
from the Bus Station, Mt. 
Pleasant.

KINGFISHER, PHANTOM, 
MONARK and CHRYSLER 

boats all at special winter 
prices with financing available. 
Open 10 - 6 Monday - Sat. ROSE 
MARINE, 537-4916, Hwy. 37 S, 
Mt. Vernon, Texas.

LIKE NEW two piece living 
room suite, stove and 

refrigerator, priced to move. 
Call 379-5411, Talco.

FOR SALE—303 rifle, like new, 
folk guitar, bronc saddle, 

hereford saddle. Call 652-5673, 
Deport.

FOR SALE— New Polyester 
dresses, size 20V̂ , $8.00 each, 

632-5141, Bogata.

FOR SALE—Five room house 
to be moved. Phone 632-5533 

or 5517, Joe Choate, Bogata.

SAVE $100.00 on repossessed 
Kirby complete with hose 

attachments and rug shampoo- 
er. See it at the Kirby 
Company, across the street 
from the bus station, Mt. 
Pleasant.

FOR SALE— 1975 Cab-over 
camper. 9>/i ft. electric or gas 

range, oven and stove, never 
used, like new. Bogata, 632- 
5031.

S Y R U P "
Hamburger

"  6 9 ‘

Q T . SIZE PLUS DEPOSIT

DEL M O N TE 303 CAN

BLACKBURN 18 O z . p i

Grape Jelly 5 9 ^
BLACKBURN RED PLUM

JA M

Bread 2 / 7 9 ‘

TRAM ISOL
And

T H IB EN ZO L
WORMING

:L MONTE 303 CAN

English Peas 3 r  1

S o d T  3 / 7 9 *

Boluses

BORDEN SWEET

MILK
Plus

Borden Vz Goi f l i

Buttermilk 5 9
BOUNTY Single

Paper
M  Towels

SEAL SWEET

ORANGE
JUICE

^  Specials Good Friday And Saturday Only At

Biscuits GROCERY
432-5424

AND MARKET
Quantity Rights Resarved

I :

North Main, Bogata



1
The Talco Times, Talco, Texas, Thursday , November 13, 1975 Page 5

FOUR GENERATIONS— 
Pete  Belcher, Timothy 
Belcher, 9 month old La 
Trishia, Herman and Jessie 
Belcher make four 
generations represented at

the 50th Wedding An­
niversary Open House for 
Herman and Jessie hosted 
by their children, Wesley 
Belcher, Dorothy Mae 
White, Pete Belcher and

Call Now For Delivery Of

C O n O N  SEED 
M EAL

This Is Old Processed Expeler Meal 

C H K K  O U R SALT PRICES

JO R D AN
Feed And Ranch Supply

,6 3 2 - 4 1 3 4  C ALL c o u t a  B o g o t a

DO YO U  SOMETIMES 
WISH YO U  HAD A 
PROFESSIONAL 
BUSINESSM AN TO 
ADVISE YO U  ON YO U R  
PERSO NAL FINANCES?

O U R  EXPERTS  A R E  
A V A I L A B L E  T O  Y O U
We advise businesses on their 
finances every day, and as a 
customer of our bank, the 
same expert services are avail­
able to you—without charge! 
So if you need personal finan­
cial assistance of any kind, see 
our professionals. We've got 
a lot of experience and we 
might be able to help you as 
we have many others. See 
us today.

TALCO 
State Bank

Member F.D.I.C.

Nancy Dugger, on Sunday, 
November 2. Herman and 
Jessie (Ewing) Belcher were 
married on October 31, 1925 
at Cuthand, Texas. Over 100 
people registered at the open 
house.

SC H O O L

I Lunck M r i u l *

Bogata, Talco and 
RIvercrest 

November 18-21 
MONDAY 
Workday 
No School 
TUESDAY

C!hicken fried steak with gravy
Frozen sweet peas
Potato and cheese casserole
Hot rolls
Ice cream
Milk

WEDNESDAY 
Hot dogs with chili 
Seasoned brown beans 
Tossed green salad 
Apple pie 
Milk

THURSDAY 
Vegetable beef soup 
Oackers
Pimento and Cheese - Peanut 
butter and jelly sandwiches 
Banana pudding 
Milk

FRIDAY 
Hamburgers 
Pinto beans 
Potato chips
Lettuce and tomato salad
Ice cream
Milk

Sixty Plus
Ned Linegar of Dallas, 

regional representative of the 
National Retired Teachers 
Association and the American 
Association of Retired Persons, 
will be the guest speaker at the 
second annual Sixty Plus 
Education Day set for 2:00 p.m. 
Friday, November 14, 1975, in 
the Student Center Ballroom at 
Paris Junior College. The 
program, arranged by the PJC 
(Continuing Education Division, 
is designed for senior citizens 
over the age of 60 to review the 
accomplishments of older 
citizens in the community. All 
those over 60 are invited to the 
free program.

Cosponsoring the event with 
the Continuing Education 
Division are the Retired Senior 
Volunteer Program , the 
Retired Federal Employees, 
the American Association of 
Retired Persons and the 
National Retired Teachers 
Association in Paris.

Wilson Norris, president of 
the local AARP, will preside 
and Paul Daniels will give the 
invocation. After a welcome by 
PJC President Louis B. 
Williams, the speaker will be 
introduced by Cecil Everett, 
president of the NRTA and the 
Senior Citizens Council. 
Recognitions will be made by 
Felix Gibson, who will in­
troduce Dee Cunningham as 
Senior Citizen of the Year, Mrs. 
Prentis Ellis as the Hidden 
Heroine of the Red River 
Valley Girl Scout (Council, and 
Mrs. Bob (Virginia) Brown, 
new coordinator of continuing 
education for senior adults. He 
also will introduce represen­
tatives of the Governor’s 
Committee on Aging and the 
Area Agency on Aging.

Linegar, the guest speaker, 
serves the NRTA and AARP 
groups in Texas, Oklahoma, 
Arkansas, Louisiana and New 
Mexico. The two groups, with 
more than 9,(XK),0(X) members, 
form the largest organization 
for older persons over 55 years 
of age in the United States. 
Linegar assumed his post with 
NRTA-AARP on July 1, 1969, 
after having served as 
manager of the Estes Park, 
Colorado Chamber of Com­
merce. Prior to that, he served 
27 years as an executive of the 
Young Men’s Christian 
Association.

He is the author of numerous 
articles and has published 
under the direction of the 
Associated Press and the 
Methodist Publishing Co. 
Linegar has directed workships 
in leadership, management, 
retirement planning and 
recreation.

Talco Personals
Bro. and Mrs. Barney Treece 

left for Dallas Tuesday to at­
tend the 75th annual session of 
the Baptist Missionary 
Association of Texas held at the 
Statler Hilton Hotel this week.

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Black, 
who is with the Air Force in 
Alamogordo, New Mexico, 
returned to their home Sunday 
after visiting his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mack Black.

Dinner guests in the home ot 
Mrs. R. W. Prestidge Sunday 
were her daughter, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Cook, 'Talco, her 
granddaughters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dale Funderburk, Jill and 
Derik of CMtimerce, Mr. and 
Mrs. Buddy K irby of 
Texarkana and Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Slaughter of Winnsboro.

Fate C^per, father of Mrs. 
Roy Worthey, is a patient in the 
Franklin County Memorial 
Hospital after suffering a heart 
attack.

Mr. anci Mrs. Lynn Fail and 
children, Wayne and Lisa, of 
Overton spent the weekend 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. C. Fail.

Mrs. Lorene Prater of Hooks 
is here visiting her daughter, 
Mrs. Don Malone and family 
this week.

Mrs. Lorene Prater of Hooks 
is here visiting her daughter, 
Mrs. Don Malone and family 
this week.

Several from here attended 
the open house for Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Whitney and family in the 
Wilkinson Community Sunday 
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Currey, 
former Talco residents, c i New 
London were here Friday to 
visit Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Kaylw 
and Mrs. (Surrey’s cousin, Foy 
Dell Stevenson, in the Titus 
County Memorial Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Kaylor 
accompanied by his sister, 
Mrs. Bill Cooper, returned 
iMHne Monday after sp>ending 
the weekend with Mrs. Kaylor’s 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. 0. F. 
Yates and family in Baytown.

Mrs. Ivy Smith returned 
Thursday after attending her 
sister, Mrs. Tomm ie Lou 
Austin, after surgery in the 
Community Hospital in 
9ierman last Monday. She is 
reported to be doing fine.

Mrs. Opal Morris, who is 
teaching in Mesquite spent the 
weekend in her home here. She 
also visited her sons, Mr. and 
Mrs. Andy Morris and Mr. and 
Mrs. Darrell Morris in Mount 
Pleasant.

Mrs. Lorene Landrum of 
Mount Pleasant spent Friday 
night with her sister, Mrs. 
Martha Jones of Talco.

Mrs. M. E. Jones ac­
companied her sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. C. Waddell, and 
another sister, Miss Mae 
Williams, to Denton Sunday 
where they spent the day with 
the Waddell’s son, Mr. and Mrs. 
(3uis Waddell.

Mrs. James Gieger is a 
patient in the Harris Memorial 
Hospital in Fort Worth.

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Miller during the 
weekend were their son, Jerry 
M iller and his daughter, 
Angelia and Mrs. M iller ’s 
sister, Mrs. Claud King, all of 
Henderson.

Roy Whitney and children of 
Longview spent the weekend 
with his mother, Mrs. Lucille 
Whitney.

Mrs. Jewell Butler was a 
limcheon guest in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Blalock in 
the Wilkinson Community 
Sunday.

Mrs. H. E. Stuart and her 
daughter, Mrs. Larry Mills, 
and little son, Scotty Joe, of 
Grannis, Arkansas spent 
Monday night and Tueklay 
with their parents and grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Northam.

Mr. and Mrs. B. D. Drury and 
son. Bill, of Kerrville spent the 
w e ^  here with her sister, Mrs. 
J. F. Stephens, Mr. Stephens 
and Trish.

Mr. and Mrs. E. O. Frye were 
luncheon guests in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Charley Foster, 
of Maud, Sunday. Others 
present were Mr. and Mrs. 
Bobby Robertson and family 
and Mrs. Buford Jorden and 
children. The Fryes also visited 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Weldon 
Johnson of Redwater.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles L. 
Grissom are the proud parents 
of a little son bom at 2:05 p.m. 
November 5,1975, in the Mount 
Pleasant Hospital and Ginic. 
He weighed 8 lbs. and was 
named Joe Charles Grissom.

Mrs. Irene Johnson of Dallas 
spent the weekend with her 
mother, Mrs. Lucy McGung, 
and sister, Mrs. Nadine Mc­
Gung.

Mrs. Jewell Butler was in 
Clarksville recently to help her 
aunt, Mrs. Ben Hill, celebrate 
her 82nd birthday. Others 
present were Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Hunter of Bogata and Mr. and 
Mrs. Gaston Hill and children 
of Clarksville.

Eldward Frye Jr., and his 
son, Tracy, spent Tuesday 
night with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. E. 0. Frye. They were in

the process of moving from 
Dallas to Denton.

Weekend guests in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Clark 
were their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. George Burleson and Cary 
Joe of Grand Prairie and 
James Paul Clark and his son, 
Rodney, of Mesquite.

Mrs. Berta Harrison of 
Detroit accompanied by her 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. V. M. 
E)avis of Carlsbad, New Mexico 
and niece, Mrs. Ethel Brewer 
of Hamlin, Texas, were here 
visiting Mrs. Ollie Reid, Mrs. 
Ruby Cogburn and other 
friends Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Roger 
Weatherall and small daughter 
have moved from Talco to 
Bogata. Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
have purchased the Weatherall 
mobil home on Wilson Street.

Mr. and Mrs. Kandy Whitten, 
of Kansas, spent from Tuesday 
until Sunday attending his 
father, Clovis Whitten, who is a 
patient in a Longview hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Whitten, 
of Kansas, spent from Wed­
nesday until Monday attending 
his father, Clovis Whitten, who 
is a patient in a Longview 
hospital. They visited with his 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Forrest 
B lair, Jr., and fam ily in 
Longview and his brother, J(^n 
Whitten, of Terrell. They spent 
Saturday night with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Sammie 
Davis and visited with a sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Otha White and 
Glen of Bogata, on Sunday 
morning.

OBITUARIES 
Jimmy Byram

Funeral services for Jimmy 
Byram of Bogata were held at 
10:00a.m. Friday, November 7, 
1975, at the Cuthand Methodist 
Church. The Rev. Lewis 
Cameron, assisted by the Rev. 
Bill Pirtle, officiated. Burial 
was made in Cuthand 
(Cemetery with the Clarksville 
Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements.

Byram was born in Red 
River County March 18, 1945, 
the son of T. R. Byram and 
Rosa Cook Byram. He was a 
member of the Cuthand 
Methodist Church.

Survivors include his mother, 
Mrs. Rosa Byram of Bogata; 
three sisters, Mrs. Mildred 
Goodson and Mrs. Billie North- 
cut, of Bogata, and Mrs. Faye 
Smith of Grand Prairie; six 
brothers, E lvis , E lvin  and 
Tommy Byram, all of Bogata, 
James Byram of Garland, 
Arkansas, Bobby Byram of 
Oockett and Harold Byram of 
Lingle, Wyoming; and several 
nieces and nephews.

Byram died Tuesday after 
the bicycle he was riding 
collided with a car.

Mrs. Cora Barton
Mrs. C ^a  Bell Barton, 90, of 

Bogata died in Red River 
Haven Nursing Home Friday 
afternoon.

Funeral services were held at 
2:00 p.m. Sunday in the Bogata 
Gmrch of Christ with Hubert 
Roach officiating. Bogata 
Funeral Home made burial in 
Bogata (Cemetery.

Mrs. Barton was born 
December 9, 1884, near
Mineola, a daughter of Richard 
Lafayette and Emma Jane 
(Spears) King. She was a 
member of Bogata Church of 
Christ. Her husband, Tom 
Barton, preceded her in death.

Survivors include two 
stepdaughters, Mrs. A. C. 
M axfield  and Mrs. Bonnie 
M iller, both of Rosemead, 
Clalifomia; a sister, Mrs. Laura 
Lowery of Paris; and several 
nieces and nephews.

Pallbearers were Aubrey 
Watters, Hollis Mathena, 
Barney Alsobrook, A lfred 
Fleming, (Jeorge Hancock and 
Tom Watters.

Mrs. Doncie Pettit
Mrs. Doncie Pettit, widow of 

E. L. Pettit, of Bogata, died in 
Red River County Hospital 
Wednesday, November 5, 1975, 
at 6:20 p.m.

Funeral services were held at 
2:00 p.m. Friday in the 
Assembly of God Church in 
Bogata. The Rev. Bill Pirtle 
officiated. Burial was made in 
Highland Cemetery.

Mrs. Pettit was bom in 
Lamar County, August 12, 1892, 
the daughter of Edward and 
Mary Oglesby Webster. She 
married E. L. Pettit, who 
preceded her in death in 1960.

Survivors include three sons, 
T ravis Pettit of Powderly, 
Austin Pettit and Houston 
Pettit, of Bogata; one brother, 
Forest Webster of Bogata; six 
grandchildren; and 12 great­
grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Rodney 
Pettit, Dennis Pettit, Fred Kee, 
Glenn Babb, O o rge  Henderson 
and Johnny Topping.

SACKED— Donald Jean
reached Tiger Quarterback 
Wade Wilson just after he 
released the football Friday 
night. (Staff Photo)

Toxicity Decision To Be Made
in individual waste dischargeA proposed policy statement 

concerning toxicity will be the 
subject of a Texas Water 
Quality Board public hearing 
scheduled for November 13 at 
9:00 a.m. in Room 118 of the 
Stephen F. Austin State Office 
Building in Austin.

The proposed statement 
reflects testimony in the record 
of a public hearing on a draft 
toxicity Board Order which was 
conducted in July, and since the 
concept has been the subject of 
discussion for approximately 
four and a half months, the 
TWQB hearing commission 
intends to close the record at 
the conclusion of this hearing.

The policy statement is in­
tended to complement the 
waste discharge permits issued 
by the Board, and will not 
reflect a change in Board policy 
of issuing individual permits 
for each discharge into waters 
of the state in lieu of general 
effluent standards. The Board 
reserves the right to establish

permits the toxicity 
requirement necessary for 
each case.

OOD WORD
from  the JBible

I cry with my voice to 
the Lord, with my voice 
I make supplication to 
the Lord.

I pour out my com­
plaint before him, I tell 
my troubles before him.

Psalms 142: 1 ,2

NOMINEE—Mona Wright
has been elected to represent 
the Dental School in Tyler as 
their home coming queen 
nominee November IS. Her 
escort w ill be Russell 
Matlock of Houston. Mona is 
secretary of her class and on 
the Dean's list. She will 
receive her degree from 
Tyler Jr. College in May 
1976. Mr. and Mrs. John I). 
Wright of Talco are her 
parents.

KIRBY & SINGER
VACUM
CLEANERS

"Two Great Names" 
__ We Service All Makes

Kirby Vacuum Cieaner Co.
Across Street From Bus Station 
Mt. Pleasant, Texas 572-2658 APPROVED tlNaCP DEALER

Prices Effective Thurs., Fri. & Sot., N o v. 13 , 14 , &* 15

Large Group Values To $1.19 If Perfect

Bath Towels
LARGE THICK & THIRSTY

Bath Cloths 5
USE OUR LAY - AW AY PLAN
BANKAMERICA80

Or Either Of 
2 Charge 

Card Plans

LARGE GROUP NOW

Jeans $ C 9 9
L E V IS & O TH E R  pR.

FAMOUS BRANDS

Men's Maverick Denim Reg. $10.99

Flare Jeans
28" To 42" 

Waist 
NOW

Men's Maverick Denim

Shirts
Reg. $9.99 Now

Sizes 14Va To 17 
Sleeve Lengths 

Up To 35"

Boys' Maverick Denim

Jeans
Reg. $7.99-Now

Regulars & Slims 
Sizes 8 To 18

EXQ UISITE FORM WEBras & Girdles
O A O /  OFF REG.

/ Q  PRICE
GIVE

Large Group Ladies 100 Percent

Polyester Slacks

Double S&H 
Green Stamps 

Eoch Wednesday 
With $2.50 Or 
More Purchase

Reg. Values 
To $12.99

Ladies' Cotton & Polyester

Dresses Reg. $9.99 

NOW

Entire Stock

Sweaters 20%
McKELLAR'S

ANNEX
Will G ive  And

F ILLE D  '•
GOLD BOND STAMP

BOOKS
IN MOUNT VERNON

SHORT 1 T 0 5  YD. LENGTHS

Polyester Knit
S o lid s  &  F a n c ie s

Large Group

Polyester Knit
ON BOLTS

Values To $3.99 Yd.

$137
■ Yd.

NEW CROP

Cracked Pecons
5 Lbs > 3 .9 9
With $5.00 Purchase

Or 5 Lbs. M .5 0
Without Purchase

Men's And Boys'

TRACK SHOES
Reg. $5.99 Pr.

1 9 9
Pair

LARGE GROUP

LACE

M cKELLAR'S DEPT.
STORE

D A I N G I R f l f l D  H U G H f S  S P R I N G S  O M A H A  M T  P l f A S A N T  M T  V f R N O N
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BAND—The R ivercrest 
Rebel band performed at 
halftime Friday night at 
Rebel Stadium. The band, 
under the direction of Waiter 
Rich is growing and im­
proving steadiiy. (S ta ff 
Photo)

C O N S U M E R  G U I D E L I N E S
If you're buying a 

bicycle for a child, and 
want to avoid injury, 
choose one to fit his 
size as he is today—not 
one he will grow into

your week ahead by dr. a.w . damis

TW IS T E D — G ary N e ill 
couldn’t get his legs un­
tangled in time to make this 
reception of a pass from 
quarterback Larry Tayior. 
The Rebel passing yardage

later. A bicycle should 
suit the rider's ability 
and kind of riding. Be 
sure to attach a head­
light and ataillight.

surpassed their rushing 
yardage during the game 
against Commerce Friday 
night, but the Rebels lost 21- 
6. (Staff Photo)

Haven Has
Halloween
Carnival

Residents at Red R iver 
Haven Nursing Home took part 
in their own Halloween Car­
nival October 31. A carnival 
was set up in the fun room and 
residents enjoyed participating 
in games and visited booths 
such as the fortune teller, fish 
pond, basketball toss, bobbing 
for apples, and pin the head on 
the skeleton.

A serving table was set up 
from which residents tasted 
witch’s brew from a black 
caldron and chocolate cookies 
which held magical potents. A 
miniature witch on a broom­
stick guarded the black kettle.

Other characters present 
were a gypsy and a friendly 
ghost. The gypsy manned the 
fortune telling broth.

Members of the Haven Teens 
helped conduct the carnival. 
Those who participated were 
LaDonna Pettigrew , Nancy 
Grant, June English, Rhonda 
W illiams, E laine Rodgers, 
Pam Byrum, Carolyn Harper, 
and Sherry Williams.

A double dividend...on this year’s calf crop 
and the next...is what a good cowman 
expects from brood cows fed.

PURIN>4 >ICCUR/VION LTD.
The do-it-all Nutritional Cowhand" so different it's patented, u s Patent no seeoe/e

The surprise is that it’s ali so easy.
When the nutritive content and feeding 

characteristics of Purina Accuration LTD are 
compared with the alternatives—hand-fed 
supplements, salt meal mixes, of liquids—it 
is easy to see why extra income at calf sale 
time should be expected. It s also easy to see 
why cows should recycle sooner and have 
earlier calves next year. This double dividend" 
—better performance from both this years 
calf crop and the next—is what makes the feed­
ing of Accuration such a logical investment 

Its patented consumption regulator 
permits Accuration to be offered free choice. 
With dependability. And with safety.

It also works like an extra hand.' Feeders 
can be placed anywhere in the pasture—to 
conserve labor, grass, supplement, and even 
the land itself. Cows normally consume 
Accuration only to the extent necessary to 
balance available roughage, be it pasture, 
range, cornstalks or stubble.

Why compromise with lesser performance 
from your brood cows when 'SUPER- 
FORMANCE is now possible with Accuration. 
Aim for heavier, thriftier calves this season— 
and next—by switching to this new kind of 
calf crop insurance. Ash for the new 

Accuration booklet ZC2141A.

M t. Pleasant Poultry & Egg
N. WASHINGTON 572-3812

ARIES
Mar. 2I-Apr. 19

TAURUS 
Apr. 20-May 20

GEM INI 
May 21-June 20

MOONCHILD 
June 21-July 22

LEO
July 23-Aug. 22 

VIRGO
Aug. 23-Sept. 22

LIBRA
Sept. 23-Oct. 22

SCORPIO 
Oct. 23-Nov. 21

SAGITTARIUS 
Nov. 22-Dec. 21

CAPRICORN 
Dec. 22-Jan. 19

AQUARIUS 
Jan. 20-Feb. 18

PISCES 
Feb. 19-Mar. 20

Forecast Period:
November 16 to November 23

Don’t repeat what you hear, this week. 
However, you will be able to draw valid 
conclusions from the gossip and rumors 
coming your way—through a third party.

There might be something questionable 
about a member of the opposite sex’s ac­
tions. Anyway, don’t jump to conclusions 
—the old “ cat and mouse”  game shows in 
your chart.

Mentally, most members of your sign 
should be sharply honed. No question 
about it, competively, you’ll hold an edge 
on the pack.

During this week’s cosmic cycle, you 
might prove to be your own worst enemy. 
Your, so-called, intuition or ESP—might 
mislead you.

Look for added responsibilities. It seems 
as though your job, task or project will 
move along at an accelerated rate.

It, most certainly, is not the time to 
become involved in long term debts or 
obligations. Bluntly, opportunity will not 
arrive in the form of an investment.

A series of favorable events will improve 
your job, task or project. Also, there’s 
good advice coming your way from a 
member of the opposite sex.

There’s a bit of flattery, admiration and 
nourishment for your ego, in the general 
scheme of things. Favorable trends among 
your associates is indicated.

You’re entering a period when you’ll ap­
preciate the simple things in life. Actually, 
reversals, during this period, will not ef­
fect you. . not in the least!

Old methods and procedures will have to 
go. Most members of your sign should take 
advantage of a new opportunity, in the of­
fering.

Take ca re ! A breakdown in com ­
munication is indicated. Faulty infor­
mation, a delayed phone call or an unread 
letter could trigger unfavorable events

New faces or, perhaps, new surroundings, 
in one form or another, will cause most 
members of your sign to forget past 
problems and reversals.

PEHSONALITY PKOFIIE
For yoor Son Sign Anoly»i», sond th« doy. month. y*o r and ploco of b irth , plus 
$1.00 fo r po ito go  ond hondling to Dr. Andrew W D om ii. f .  O. Bex 12766, 
St. Fotoriburg, Florido 33733.

CANCER
Answerkline

American Cancer Society

.1 young secretary writes: 
“ I was a very enthusiastic 
bike rider but I’ ve put away 
my bike for good. I fell off 
my bike recently, and as 1 
did, I hit my breast on the 
handlebars. 1 am worried that 
1 may have given myself 
breast cancer. I'm sorry I 
ever learned to ride that 
thing.”
ANSWERIine: Breast cancer 
is absolutely NOT caused by 
a blow or injury •• no matter 
how many people think so. 
This is a myth and you are 
giving up an enjoyable form 
of exercise for no reason at 
all. You might ask your 
local American Cancer So­
ciety unit for a leaflet about 
breast cancer and the im­
portant practice of breast 
self-examination. Monthly 
breast self-examination 
helps protect you against 
breast cancer. By all means, 
go ahead and enjoy bike 
riding.

scientist at the University of 
California at Los Angeles 
of Public Health indicated 
that members of this religious 
group have a cancer mor­
tality rate that is 50 to 60 
percent that of the U.S. 
population in general. Many 
Mormons live according to a 
doctrine which insists on a 
moderate diet and forbids the 
use of things like tobacco, 
alcohol and addictive drugs.

■  ■  ■  ■  ■  ■  ■  N t o E S I s Q h - . ™  ■  ■  ■  ■  ■  ■

A husinessman asks; "Are 
more men than ever dying of 
cancer?”
ANSWERIine; Unfo'tunately, 
the cancer death rate for 
American men has been going 
up. But, this is mostly due 
to the enormous Increase in 
the amount of male lung can­
cer deaths (which have gone 
up 20 times in the last 45 
years.) These deaths could 
be largely eliminated if there 
was no cigarette smoking. If 
you subtracted lung cancer 
statistics, the cancer death 
rate for American men would 
be going down. In other 
words, men are being saved 
from many forms of cancer 
but lung cancer pushes the 
mortality statistics way up.

An l:aslCoast resident asks: 
" Is  it true that the Mormans 
of Utah have less cancer 
than the rest of us?”  
ANSWERIine; A recent study 
of the Mormons done by a

A busy mother explains; 
*’My schedule is far too 
hectic for me to go to a l i ­
brary and read up on the 
danger of cigarettes, but 1 do 
want to give the facts to my 
children. Can you help?”  
ANSWERIine; If you check 
with your local American 
Cancer Society Unit, you’ ll 
save a library trip and time. 
The ACS has special color­
ful leaflets for your 
youngsters with plenty of 
cartoon pictures that get the 
facts across in a zippy way. 
There is material for older 
children, and everything is 
yours for the asking.

Question: "What’ s the most
common form of cancer?”  
ANSWERIine; Superficial 
skin cancer is the most com­
mon form of cancer with some 
300,000 to 600,000new cases 
expected in 1975. Fortu­
nately, this form of cancer is 
highly curable as well as 
common. It is easy to diag­
nose and there are simple 
ways of treating it. The 
main cause is excessive ex­
posure to the sun.

4 regular lealnre  o !  this 
Htuspaper prepared h\ 
your American t .an te r  
Socie ty  to help  s a te  \ottr 
l i fe  from cancer,

r .  o .  i i o s  ’’Sf't
Austirr, les a s  ^tt'^Oh

Bass Fishing Book Released
Take a bass fisherman who 

has always spent his time 
dunking plug after plug deep 
into brush-filled waters and 
we’ll show you a bass fisher­
man who has a lot to learn 
about catching bass.

The Fisherman Books 
division of Cordovan Cor­
poration has just released 
“ Topwater Fishing”  by Max 
Eg^eston, a book packed with 
the kind of bass action plug- 
dunkers can’t hope to ex­
perience.

‘ ‘Topwater Fishing”  is 
available by mail from Cor­
dovan Corporation, 5314 Bingle

Road, Houston, Texas, 77018 
and sells for $7.25 in hardcover, 
$4.25 in softcover.

Author Max Eggleston is of 
the old school of bass fishermen 
and he’ll teach you to fish the 
way some men hunt big game 
— by stalking them, coaxing 
them and waiting them out.

When you finish this book you 
won’t need fancy trolling 
motors or depth finders or fish 
sonars or even jumpsuits with 
patches from all the bait 
companies to show you’re a 
fisherman. You’ll know it and 
your full stringers will prove it.

Eggleston, a resident of

Redfish For East Texas 
Lake Striker First

TYLE R  — Saltwater redfish 
for inland lakes is a reality and 
Lake Striker recently became 
the first public water in East 
Texas to be stocked with the 
fast-growing fish.

Lake Striker received some 
19,0(X) redfish last week with the 
initiation of a Parks and 
Wildlife Department fisheries 
transplanting project which 
holds stunning possibilities for 
Texas fishermen. A longtime 
dream of fisheries biologists, 
delayed for years because of a 
lack of sufficient quantities of 
small redfish, has become a 
reality with a breakthrough in 
the artificial rearing of the fish.

Federal and state biologists 
at the National Marine 
Fisheries Service laboratory in 
Port Aransas have successfully 
induced redfish to spawn under 
artificial light and temperature 
conditions with staggering 
results. In a few weeks, six 
adult redfish produced more 
than 70 million eggs.

'The redfish fry hatched from 
the eggs are transferred to the 
P&WD Palacios Marine 
Fisheries Station where they 
are kept in saltwater rearing 
ponds for approximately 30 
days.

In that 30-day period, the fry 
grow to IVi-inch fingerling size 
and are ready to be stocked in 
inland waters.

Redfish grow rapidly in 
freshwater and P&WD fishery 
biologists predict some of these 
fish will attain weights of 20-

pounds or more within three 
years.

In order to determine the 
most sutable habitat for redfish 
in inland waters, a virtual 
c irc le  o f medium-size im ­
poundments around the state 
will be stocked.

Other impoundments in East 
Texas to be stocked with 
redfish in the coming weeks are 
Cypress Springs, Athens and 
Jacksonville. Lakes being 
considered in other areas of the 
state include Wichita, White 
River, Brady, White Rock, 
Casa Blanca and Corpus 
Christ!.

For freshwater stocking, the 
fingerling redfish are tran­
sported from  the Palacios 
facility by P&WD hatchery 
tank trucks to the inland 
reservoirs.

Since the fish are transported 
in saltwater, they must be 
tempered by the gradual ad­
dition of lakewater to the truck 
tanks, a process normally 
requiring two to four hours. 
When the tiny fish are ac­
climated to the fresh water, 
they are released into the lake.

Flourescent lights are more 
energy-efficien t than in­
candescent lights. One 40-watt 
flourescent tube gives out more 
light than three 60-watt in­
candescent bulbs—you can 
save about $10 a year in elec­
tricity.

Denison, Texas, has been a 
professional guide on Lake 
Texoma since World War II. He 
writes a monthly feature for All 
Outdoors Magazine, a weekly 
column for The Sherman 
Democrat and is a frequent 
contributor to The Texas 
Fisherman.

He bases his new book on 
over 50 years of topwater thrills 
from Katmai, Alaska, to the 
Florida Keys beginning back in 
the early 1920s when a ten-foot 
fly rod was standard tackle for 
topwater and most plugs were 
hand-carved.

Eggleston reports on the 
improvements in fishing tackle 
made during the years to follow 
including level wind spinning 
reels, dropseat reel handles, 
artific ia l lures and 
monofilament fishing lines.

He provides details on fishing 
techniques learned through 
painful tria l and error to 
support theories sometimes 
COTitrary to other fishermen’s 
experiences. He finds high noon 
and hot weather two of the most 
productive fishing times. And 
he doesn’t let muddy water 
dissuade him from tossing a 
few casts.

“ Topwater Fishing”  is a 
history book, it is a valuable 
reference work and it is a 
necessity for the bass angler 
who thins he’s tried it all.

“They say
you don’t understand 
Am erican business... 
I say you do.’’
The American Free Enterprise System operates on the premise you get what 
you pay for.
When the flour a bakery buys goes up, the baker must sell a loaf of bread for 
more money, or go out of business. If he cannot buy the ingredients, pay his 
rent, taxes, fuel bills, employee wages and have a little money left over for 
himself, then he must close his doors. That’s the way the American system 
works, and it is the best system we know.
Community Public Service Company is doing everything possible to keep 
charges for electric service at a reasonable level, consistent with good business 
practices. Transmission lines and transformers must be repaired, improved, 
and in some cases replaced. Maintenance equipment must be kept in good 
working order to service the lines, poles and substations that keep you and your 
family supplied with dependable electricity.
Unlike the baker, we cannot change rates daily or monthly. Periodically electric 
rates are adjusted to a level that will enable the electric company to pay for 
operational costs, construction costs, and pay a reasonable rate of return to 
investors who provide the money to build or maintain the 
electric service facility.
A "fuel adjustment” clause is utilized in order to allow the Company to recover 
the increased cost of fuel occurring after the base electric rate is calculated.
The foreign oil embargo and exorbitant prices have put a strain on domestic oil 
reserves and increased the demand for natural gas, which is in short supply. 
These fuel increases are factors which we cannot control.
We don’t like the ‘‘fuel adjustment charge” and we know you don’t like it either. 
But until fuel prices level off, or new sources of energy are developed, 
we must do the best we can.

R. D. Woofter 
President

COMMUNITY PUBLIC SERVICE
/our Deciric Ughi & Fbvt/er Company

An Equal Opportunity Employar

E40-75


