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Car Damages 
House, Leaves Scene

During the night Sunday, 
July 19 an unidentified 
driver swerved off of North 
Main Street in Bogata, 
crossed a porch and ran into 
the front of Mrs. Lorena 
Willson’s home.

The driver did not stop, but 
backed out into the street 
and left the scene of the 
accident

Extensive damage to the 
southwest corner of the 
living room and carport 
resulted to the brick 
structure.

Mrs. Willson, who was 
asleep on the other side of 
the house, heard the noise, 
but did not get up to in­
vestigate, not realizing that 
something had actually hit

her home
Bricks were scattered into 

the living room of the house, 
and outside and down the 
street.

Neighbors had seen a light 
colored early 1970 model 
vehicle racing up and down 
streets, spinning tires and 
backing in and out of 
driveways earlier on the

same evening.
W.T. Davis of the Red 

River County Sheriff’s 
Department is investigating 
the accident, and attempts to 
locate the driver of the 
vehicle are being made at 
the present time.

Repairs to Mrs. Willson’s 
home were started -m- 
mediately.

Robins, Friends, Cheerful Songsters
By Nanalee .Nichols

The robin, perhaps one of 
the best known birds in the 
United States, is abundant in 
the East Texas area.
The black capped head and 

bright red breast catchs the 
eye, as well as the somewhat 
pompous strut he affects 
when hopping jauntily over 
lawns.
Robins are a member of the 

i true Thrush family, a 
medium sized bird with a 
song that is, perhaps, 
somewhat overated as far as 
melody is concerned. They 
do not sing in long, 
melodious stretchs, but 
rather short, but very cheery 
bursts
'The fact that the robin’s 

snatchs of song are often the 
first sounds of spring heard 
throughout a cold and bitter

winter’s end undoubtedly 
has endeared both song and 
bird to many people.
The bird was named for the 

robin of England, when 
colonists, homesick for their 
native countryside, noticed 
the strong resemblance of 
the American bird to that of 
the English one. The english 
cousin has a much brighter, 
redder breast, and a sweeter 
song
In the East Texas area the 

birds are often found nearly 
all year long. The young 
hatched up north replace 
those hatched in the local 
area each fall. The local 
birds move further south and 
the northern ones settle in 
during all but the coldest 
part of winter.
They are remarkably tame 

and friendly, often nesting on

porchs, or in trees next to 
windows. Their fear of man 
seems minimal, and many 
nests of young robins can be 
found in the area right now.
The carefully tended lawns 

of today’s homeowner are 
perfect for worm, beetle and 
insect hunting by robin 
redbreast.
Perhaps Mr. Robin may 

think the lawns provided for 
his benefit, thus explaining 
his friendliness toward 
mankind.
At one time, however, man 

was not such a friend. In the 
early part of the century 
robins were classified as 
game or sport birds, and 
hunted by the thousands.
People today consider them 

almost a symbol of spring, 
and would never consider 
making a robin pot pie, but

that wasn’t an unusual dish 
at all back around 1900. Such 
hunting has long since been 
outlawed, however.
A harmless, cheerful little 

bird, they also do great good 
by destroying thousands of 
harmful insects. They are 
prized by many with their 
comic antics of hopping, 
nibbling at worms and 
providing a bright flash of 
color and a cheery song for 
the people of the area.
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BROKEN OUT— Mrs.
Lorena Willson of Bogata 
received a shock when a 
car crashed into her

house sometime Sunday 
night. The car backed out 
and sped away without

Street Shows Brahman
Jim Bob Street, a nine 

year old member of the 
Franklin  County 4-H, 
represented his county in the 
Texas Junior Brahman Show 
and in the All American Na­
tional Junior Brahman SKjw 
held at the Heart of Texas 
Fairgrounds in Waco June 
23-27. During the five days 
221 children from six dif­
ferent states showed a total 
of 379 head of cattle. Cattle 
w ere shown in classes accor­
ding to their ages and 
whether bulls or heifers.

Jim showed a 14 month old 
registered giay Brahman 
named “ Henry”  that he has

raised himself and shown at 
^rious local shows. In the 

^fexas Show, he placed se- 
cJnd and won a red ribbon, 
fjed tub and thirty dollars, 
n the National Show, he 

placed third with a white rib- 
(H)n and fifty-five dollars

Jim is the son of Artie and 
Sue Street of Route 1, Talco. 
The 1982 National Ju.iior 
Brahman Show will be held 
in Lake Charles, Louisiana 
and Jim will be representing 
Franklin County 4-H again, 
and hoping for top honors.

Every hour of each day 
was filled with fam ily 
oriented events and enter­

tainment, such as ham­
burger suppers, programs, 
dances, lectures, barbecues, 
w aterm elon  eating, 
breakfasts, banquets, and 
many more, but most impor­
tant, the feeding and care of 
their animals 

A state and nationa. show 
is held each summer. It is a 
well supported event for any 
boy or girl ages 9 through 21 
that might be interested in 
the Brahman breed. Anyone 
interested in the 1982 show in 
Lake Charles may contact 
the Franklin County Agent’s 
office or Artie Street.

4-H ’ers Participate In District Revue

YOUNG ROBINS—the 
robin is one of the best 
known birds in the United 
States. This small pair

fell from their nest and 
are being raised by hand 
on raw round steak. They 
are quite tame and will

Bogata Y ouths Make Trip
Rev Billy Harris and C.D. 

Glass accompanied a group 
of youth to Six Flags 
Tuesday. Making the trip in 
the Church Van were;

and will

perch upon fingers or 
shoulders and are in the 
process of learning to fly. 
(Staff Photo)

It was early Thursday 
morning that the Red River 
County 4-H participants left 
on their journey to the 
Northeast District 4-H 
Fashion Revue, theme;
“ Fashions Round the Clock”  
in Longview at the Contessa 
Inn. Sharing this special 
event with the 4-H’ers wer e 
their parents; Mrs. Venita 
Jo Oldfield, Mrs. Mary 
Warren, Mr. and Mrs. David 
Zehetner and son, and Mrs.

Nita Dennison and County 
Agent, Brea da Hunter.

Although five 4-H’ers were 
scheduled to attend the 
District Dress Revue only 
four were able to make the 
trip. In the beginner division. 
Heather Dennison from the 
Midway 4-H club brought 
home with her a Blue Award 
ribbon for her casual wear; 
Sherrell Richardson our 
beginner for special oc- 
cassion was unable to attend.

In the Junior division 
Rebecca Zehetner from the 
Manchester 4-H club, in 
casual wear received a Blue 
Award ribbon; Melissa 
Warren from the Pinebranch 
4-H club in special occassion 
also received a Blue Award 
ribbon . In our Senior 
division we only had one 
representative, Jana Old­
field from the Midway 4-H 
club in special occasion 
received a red ribbon.

Charles Don Lewis, Brad 
Branch, Tim Wood, Tony 
jJasso, Jenifer Glass, Deanna 
Damron and Kathy Littrell.

Rev. Griffin To Speak
Rev. Carroll Caddell 

announces that Rev. David 
Griffin of Sonora will be the 
speaker at the First United 
Methodist Church in Bogata 
Sunday July 26, for the

morning worship service and 
Brady Fisher at the evening 
service. Rev. Griffin is the 
former pastor and Mr. 
Fisher is the County Judge in 
Lamar County.

Lodjje To Install Officers
There will be an in­

stallation of officers at the 
next meeting of 
Rosalie Lodge 527 AFAM,

Thursday evening July 23 at 
8;00 p.m. AH members and 
visiting masons are 
welcome.

Nichols Worth
By Nanalee Nichols 

Okay, world, give us a 
break. We don’t need 
anymore cats. Now, as most 
of you have heard, I keep a 
full compliment (around six) 
of cats at home. If I want to 
keep my husband, I better 
not bring any more in.

So when one of our workers 
brought a cute, but injured 
black and white kitten in, 
that she found on the side of 
the road, we kept it at the 
office, doctored it, and got it

in good shape. Then we gave 
it away.

Within two days, someone 
dumped a tiny white kitten, 
hungry and bedraggled, out 
on main street.

We ignored tne poor thing 
for a couple of days, then 
sighed and brought it in. Now 
it is receiving the luxury 
treatment.

Please, no more kittens, 
we have all we can handle!

.
MAJOR dam age and 
minor injuries resulted 
from a two-vehicle acci­
dent at 9:45 p.m. Sunday, 
July 19 three miles south

■ ■

" J. < r
of Bogata on Hwy. 37. A 
1977 Ford Courier pickup 
driven northbound by 
Jaguar Coffman of Gar­
vin, Okla., struck the rear

of a northbound 1976 Vega 
station driven by Jimmy 
Martin of Talco. Coff­
man, Martin and a 
passenger in the Coffman

truck were treated and 
released from Red River 
General Hospital. (Staff 
Photo)

Tractor Pull Has New Location
Again this year local 

people will participate in the 
annual Paris Young Far-

T h k  B(k ;.a t a  N k w s
people.

The main change in the 
event this year will be the 
location. The new location 
will be on Loop 286 NW of 
Paris, between City Elec- 
trick and Cagle’s The new 
site will have a three hun­
dred foot long track, as 
compared to the old track at
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the Rodeo Arena in Paris, 
which was only half as long. 
The Young Farmers 
presently have some 500 
seats erected, but will put up 
2000 more on Thursday 
before the pull. There will 
also be room for people to 
back their pickups in and sit 
on tailgates, or to put up 
lawn chairs to sit in. Parking 
will be more than adequate.

'The first night of the pull 
will be on Friday, July 24 at

7:30 p.m. That night’s 
perform ance will feature
5.500 pound modified tractor 
stock, 7,500 super stock, 9,000 
pound stock, 9,200 modified 
and 12,000 superstock 
classes.

A special.and first time 
event will be a 5,800 four- 
wheel drive superstock 
pickup truck class.

Saturday classes will 
include an antique class,
5.500 pound superstock, 
12,000 pound stock, 7,200

stopping. The case is 
under investigation by the 
Red River County

Sheriff’ s Department. 
(Staff Photo by Linda 
Tabb)

Jim Bub Street

New Rig Put In Service
CRC Circle M, Inc., an 

operation of Crutcher 
Resources Corporation, 
Houston, recently took 
delivery of a new rig at its 
Kilgore yard and put it into 
service for Dallas-based 
Texas Oil & Gas Corp. Rig 
supervisor is Jackie Woods 
and crew chief is Paul 
Snelling.

Fred T. Maxwell, 
president, says Rig 28 brings 
the CRC Circle M fleet to 26 
workover units, one drilling 
rig and 12 vacuum tank 
trucks at yards in Giddings 
and Talco, Texas, as well as 
K i l g o r e ,  c o m p a n y  
headquarters.

Rig 28 is a new Crane 
Carrier Model 4(X) workover

unit with a %-foot mast. 
Hookload is 215,(X)0-pounds 
with drawworks powered by 
an 8V92 GM diesel engine. A 
JWS 300 National triplex 
pump is driven by a GM 6V92 
diesel engine. The unit has a 
220-barrel mud tank.

For safer, faster work, 
other power equipment 
includes a Cooper model 60 
power sub and King 75-WP 
swivel. The rig is capable of 
workovers to 16,000 feet.

CRC Circle M performs oil 
and gas well completion, 
workover and servicing in 
East Texas, Central and 
South Texas and North 
Louisiana. Rig yards are 
located in Kilgore, Carthage, 
Talco and Giddings, Texas.

modified and 9,500 pound 
superstock classes.

That night will be the 
evening for the 6,200 
modified four-wheel drive 
trucks.

Competitors from Texas, 
O klahom a, A rkansas, 
Louisiana and Mississippi 
will vie for $9,300 in prize 
money.

Proceeds from the tractor 
pull will help sponsor Young 
Farm er and community 
activities.

NEW CRC Circle M Rig 
28 was recently delivered 
to the company’s Kilgore 
yard and put into service 
for Texas Oil & Gas Corp. 
Left to right: Bill
Maxwell, vice president:

Jam es Dacus, shop 
foreman, and Travis 
Barton, supervisor of rig 
operations, CRC Circle 
M, with the Crane Carrier 
Model 400 workover unit.
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Your Home Town Bank

Friendly, Personal Service

Serving The Community With Dedication

Deport, Texas

__________________

NATION B&N
BROS. Track Stop

FERTILIZER 982-5805 

Hwy. 82 E.,
Fertilizer, Seed

Blossom

We Want To Help
You With Your

Finest In Food

and
Agricultural Needs Service

Blossom, Texas

DEPORT BANG'S
INSURANCE WEST SIDE

AGENCY GROCERY
Your Local • Fresh Meat Market

Independent Agency
• Fresh Produce

652-6211 Office
* Full Line Of Staples

Auto Fire
Home Owners • Fast, Friendly 

Service
Farm-Business

Hwy. 82 West,
Deport Blossom

ROACH ROLLINS
OIL GRO.
CO. Charles & DrucJa Rollins

Gas, Diesel, Oil, Candy

Complete Service Sandwiches

652-4400 Feed

Hwy. 271
Deport Deport

DEPORT DEPORT
SPEED CABINET
WASH SHOP

Newly Remcxieled Finest In 
Custom Cabinets

Car Wash

Is Open 652-4373

Deport

Deport

DEPORT BLOSSOM
FARM TEXACO

SUPPLY Steve Nethery

652-5845 Owner/Operator

Custom Spreading
* Wheel Balancing
* New & Used Tires

* Bulk Garden Seed * Batteries Charged
• Evergreen Feed • Flats Fixed 

• •  Minor Repairs
Deport

GIFFORD'S roOD STORE

* Fresh Meat Market • Frozen Foods 

* Large Selection Of Canned Goods 

• Fresh Produce

Friendly Local People Providing 

Convenience orni Fast Service

IT'S A BRIGHT IDEA!!,
Shopping At Your Local Stores

Makes Sense--Dollars and Cents 
You liever Worry About Parking, 
Poor Quality, Or Lack Of Personal 

Service, and With Gasoline Prices 
So High, You Can Realiv Save!

NARON TV in Bogata 
offers great service at 
reasonable prices, parts, 
antennas, antenna in­

stallation, and freindly 
service. They invite 
customers to drop by for a

“ get-acquainted”  visit 
and hope to serve the area 
in every possible way.

v r i
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CONS mm

S v
T R I - A N G L E  Co n -  A.F. "B uddy”  West- construction one might
struction company, in brook. They are ready to need, and specialize in
Bogata, is operated by help with whatever custom building.

DEPO RT CABINET bathroom cabinets or gun
SHOP can design and cases the customer might
bklld almost any type of desire. Cliff Randle,
bookshelves, cabineU, owner and operator.

displays this TV stand 
with a swivel top. (Staff 
Photo)

THE
TAUX) STATE BANK

Locally Owned, Locally Staffed,

Providing Friendly, Personal Attention 

For All Your Banking Needs

Member F.D.I.C.

Talco, Texas 1

GUSS
AUTO
PARTS
Your L<xal 

Green Light Dealer

We Have All 
You Need For Your 

Auto 
Bogota

BUCKMAN 1 
DRUG, INC.I

We're Here To 1 
Serve You I 

Gifts, Cosmetics, 1 
Health Needs I

Bill Buckman, R.Ph. I 
Morris Foster, R.Ph.l 

Bogota I

PAT'S
PLACE

a iP  THIS OUT
AND PRESENT TO 

PAT'S PLACE

T O G £ T 4 Q y^ O FF  

ANY JEAN IN THE STORE!!

Bogota

SPEIR
&

SPEIR
UPHOLSTERY

All Work 1 
Guaranteed I 

FREE ESTIAAATES I
632-4535 Shop I 
632-4484 Home 1

TRIANGLE ACE
CONSTRUCnON Furniture &

GO. Hardware ISee Us For All
Your Construction • Lawn Mowers I
Needs, No Matter • Tillers I

How Large Or Small • Garden Seed I
Complete Line O f  I

Buddy Westbrook Garden Tools 1
Bogota George 8 Jeon Smith 1

Bogoto 1

HUDDLESTON'S TURNER'S
GROCERY DRYGOODS

* Large Selection
FACE TOWELS I

Frozen Foods

• Fresh Meat Market $3 Value Ea. 2̂ 1
* A lt Kinds Of Feed Ladies I
• Ice BLUE JEANS
* Gasoline $18.95 Value $12 1
* Vet Supplies Main Street I

Bogota Bogota 1
••eseaateaaaesetataiaaaaeaaaaaessaesetaaaaeaesasaaAsai ieeeseeei##e#eaeeeieeeeeeeeeeeee»«es#seeeeeeeeeel

BOGATA 271
PAINT & TEXACO

BODYSHOP The Finest
Complete In Texaco ProJucts,

Muffler Service With

Wheel Alignment
Friendly, Efficient 

Service

Hwy. 271

Bogota Bogota

BOGATA NEWS NARONDEPORT TIMES
BLOSSOM TIMES TV SERVICE

TALCO TIMES
Friendly, Personal 

Service
Serving The Needs Of We Install Antennas,

The Area With
Repair TV's

Locd News,

Pictures Good Selection
and Information Of Used TV's

Hwy. 271 Bogota
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Rickey Harold Little 
and

Vickie Kathryn Humphrey

BIG FISH — Shayne  
Hliitney displays a lOM, 
lb. channel catfish caught

f f

Compare price, compare quality —  you 
cannot beat the values on prescription 

S  eyewear at TSO. And that's true fora// TSO 
:: eyewear, including famous designer frames.

T e x a h  S i a t f :

O l niCAl5
E. Side Plara, Paris, Tx.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Goodson, Schayne and 
Woody visited her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. R.G. Sanders 
and her son, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ricky Sparks and children in 
Henderson Saturday and 
Sunday. Schayne stayed 
until his grandparents 
brought him home Monday 
afternoon.

Mrs. Kate M cElroy is 
moving from Talco to 106 
south Van Buren, Mt. 
Pleasnt this week.

Jeremy Lynn Jones is the 
name of the son bom to Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Lynn Jones 
on July 6, 1981 at the Titus 
County Memorial Hospital. 
He weighed 7 lb. 9V« oz. His 
grandmothers are Mrs. 
Imogene Lewis and Mrs. 
Barbara Stansell.

Here visiting Mrs. Nona 
Gieger in the home of her son

and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Gieger this week 
were her niece Odessa 
B i^op of Nathez, Miss, with 
her granddaughter, June 
Ward and sons, Travis and 
Jason of Zedalia, La.

Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Fiye have returned home 
after spending eleven days 
at Daisey park on Lake 
Greeson in Ark. Also cam­
ping at Daisey Park with the 
Frye’s w ^e, Mr. and Mrs. 
Troy Lewis, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Vickers and Mr. and 
Mrs. Randy Nolen all of 
Talco. Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Russell and boys of Sao 
Paulo, Brazil; Mr. and Mrs. 
John Lilley, Jon and Janay 

of Clebum; Mr. and Mrs.
Glen Burks of Russellville, 
Ark were Wednesday 
visitors. Joining them on

Talco Locals

Humphrey-Little 
Announce Engagement

Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
Humphrey of Paris have 
announced the engagement 
and approaching marriage 
of their daughter, Vickie 
Kathryn, of Paris, to Rickey 
Harold Little of Paris, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Little and the late Mary 
Faye Little.

The bride-elect’s grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
M.L. Byrd of Bogata and 
Mrs. Viva Humphrey and the 
late Lucian Humphrey of 
Clarksville. The groom to be 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Gilbert M. Sulsar of 
Bogata and Mr. Amon 0. 
Little of Paris and the late 
Annis Little.

T h e  s e m i - f o r m a l  
ceremony will be held at 7

p.m. on Friday, July 31 in the 
Calvary Baptist Church with 
the Rev. Larry Solice of­
ficiating.

The bride-elect graduated 
from Paris High School in 
1973, and worked in the 
Avery Independent School 
District as a teacher. She is 
currently working toward a 
M.A. at East Texas State 
University.

The groom to be graduated 
from Paris High School in 
1975 and served in the United 
States Marine Corps. He is 
now emi^oyed by Babcock 
and Wilcox in Paris.

No invitations will be sent. 
All friends and relatives are 
cordially invited to attmd.

City Sales Tax 
Payments Are Higher

on a trot line at Pat 
Mayes Lake while on 
vacation recently.

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock Tuesday said 
payments of the optional 
one-percent city sales tax for 
1961 to Texas cities are 17 
percent higher on a 
statewide average compared 
to last year.

Bullock’s office Tuesday 
paid 713 Texas cities 
$32,698,770 in sales tax 
rebates for July.

City sales taxes are 
collected by merchants and 
businesses along with the

state’s four percent sales tax 
and are rebated monthly by 
the Comptroller’s office.

Statewide, Texas cities 
have received $343.4 million 
during 1981 compared to 1980 
payments through July of 
$791.9 million.

Rebates for our area were: 
Blossom-$4,139; Bogata- 
$9,428; Deport-$3,060; and 
Talco-$15.40R.

Buy, Sell or Rent 
With Classified Ads

Everyday prices
at T S O  

are lower than 
most advertised 
discount”  prices.

22" MASTER CUT

LAWN MOWER $15Q
With Quick Adjusting 
Ball Bearing WheelsSUMMER 22" STANDARD

LAWN MOWER *135

TOOL BOXES
All Metal 

For Wide Bed 
Pickup

*90

SPRAYERS
Non Corrosive Polyethylene

r.Oo,*21« 30o?24“
Lyntox D. Lyntox

C A H LE SPRAY LIVESTOCK DUST
Gol. *19 20 Lbs. *18’®

DISCONTINUED COLORS IN WEEDKILLER FLY BAIT
OUTSIDE POLYFLEX LATEX $ 4 5  ,it.c=„*35®

Sale
Jones Blair Reg.»13.95 $Q

 ̂ M ALATHION HAY TWINEINSIDE SATIN X n f t i i w i m t
LATEX DISCONTINUED $ 2 5 0  Hy Y ie ld 6000 Ft. Bole ^

COLORS Gol.

BKYSON BIDG. & fARM SUPPLY
718 N. Main

Lumber-Hordwore-Plumbtng d Electric Supplies

____________ 632-5116 _____ Bogota, Tx.

CHUCK ALLUMS, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Allums of Tyler, has been 
elected to the Rose 
Capital Little League All- 
Star Team. Chuck pitches 
for the Western Senior 
League Royals, who won 
the League Championship 
in Tyler in their 1981 
season. He will be a fresh­
man at Robert E. Lee 
High School this fall. He is 
the grandson of Mr. and 
Mrs. George Allums of 
Bogata and Mrs. Robert 
D. Jones of Dallas.

Buy, Sell or Rent 
With Classified Ads

Friday for a family picnic 
were Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Lewis of Mt. Pleasant, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lloyd Lewis and 
Jana, Mr. Phillip Bocox, 
Chris and Casey all from 
Texarkana; Mr. and Mrs. 
Wledon Johnson,Redwater 
and Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Stanger of Overon.

Mrs. J.L. Ottinger and 
Mrs. Ima Sikes have been 
dismissed from the Titus 
County Memorial Hospital.

The Rev,. Reese Howard 
was guest speaker at the 
Calvary Baptist Church 
Sunday. He was a lunchion 
guest in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Paul Miller.

Mrs. Billy Jean Stanley 
and daughter and grand­
daughter from Witchita 
Falls ahve been visiting Mrs. 
Stanley’s parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Jones for several 
days, while here Mrs. 
Stanley entered the Titus 
County Memorial Hospital 
for treatment.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert Wheat 
of Stockton, Calif, visited 
here during the week with 
their cousin Mr. and Mrs. 
E.O. Frye.

Mr. and Mrs. Omie Hanks 
spent the weekend with their 
daughter and husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Donald Newman 
and family of Ft. Worth 
during the weekend.

Jeannie Beth Horn and 
Becky Heath and daughter , 
Hollie of Lufkin spent the
weekend with their grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J.E. 
Hwn.

Mrs. J.R. Gable and 
children of Clarksville 
visited Friday with her 
mother, Mrs. Sidney Frugia.

Mr. and Mrs. L.B. Couch of 
Texas City, Texas spent the 
weekend with his sister and 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. A.E. 
Foster.

Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Whitney and children cf Mt 
Pleasant were dinner guests 
in the home of his mother, 
Mrs. Lula Whitney and 
Dumas Whitney Sunday.

Those attending the Daniel

Springs Baptist En­
campment near Gary, Texas 
from the First Baptist 
Church last week were Amy 
Stockton, Sandy Brooks, 
Amy Stansell, MeLissa 
Brooks, Darlene Brooks,
Brandi Jones, Cliff Martin, 
Timmy Jones and Grant 
Barnett and their sponsors, 
the Rev. and Mrs. Terry

Barnett and Mrs. Gerald 
Martin.

Gavin Barnett spent last 
week with his grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Bryan 
of Center.

Jewell Forsyth has been 
dismissed from the Mc- 
Cuistion Hospital in Paris.

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon 
Johnson of Redwater and 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Lewis of 
Mt. Pleasant were here 
Saturday to visit Mr. and 
Mrs. Albert Wheat of

Staockton, Calif. While they 
were visiting in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. E.O. Frve.

Miss Paula Cargile of
Grand Prairie visit^  her 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
R.L. Clark Saturday and 
Sunday.

Nicole, Hayden and Jill 
Perdue of Ennid, Okla. are 
spending three weeks with 
their grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Olen Williams while 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leo Perdue are on an ar­
cheology trip to Israel.

Mrs. Bernice Simmons 
accompanied her niece and 
nephew, Mr. and Mrj. Pat 
Stephens to Keerville 
Saturday where they visited 
with another niece and 
husband, Mr. and Mrs. 
Chuck Drury.

Vivian Westbrook spent 
Sunday in Mt. Pleasant 
visiting her brother, Jeffery

Smith and wife, Mr. Smith 
has just been released from 
the VA Hospital in 
Smeveport.

Eugene Mankins a c ­
companied his son-in-law 
Jerry Russelll and his 
grandson, Greg to Grand 
Saline Monday where Greg 
had an appointment to see an 
allergy specialist.

Post Master, Mrs. Marie 
McGoniall was in Greenville 
last week being oriented in 
the handling of the new Zip 
Code.

Ivy Smith visited Mrs. 
V.L. Taylor in the Titus 
County Memorial Hospital 
Monday. She also visited 
with the family of Alice 
Brown a patient there in 
intensive care.

have a
nice w eekend...

BACON
Slob Sliced 

Lb.

9 9 ’

PEPSI
COLA

2 Liter

$ 1 0 9

TOWELS
2 Roll 

Pock.

8 9 ’

CANNED DRINKS

INSTANT TEA Lipton 4 Oz. $099

COFFEE BREAD MILK
Tolg^i s Llj.

$ 1 9 9
Wonder

4 9 9
■  A  Large Loof

$909

JOE FORD GROCERY
Speciols Good Friday & Saturday July 24-25 Quantities Reserved

SMITH CARPETS
GIGANTIC
APTm-INViNTORY S A U

Evans*Black b y  A rm strong

WEMBLEY
•100% autoclave heat-set nylon fiber pile. 
•Versatile, low profile saxony texture offers 

an elegant look fot today’s budget-minded 
consumer

Compare
>1100 695

Sq. Yd.

Evans*Black b y  Arm strong

CHAUMONT
•Silky-soft fine denier yarns 
•Ultra-soft hand and flowering carved 
design provide a feeling of luxury, 

decorating versatitlity.

Comapre
$ 1 6 9 5 11 95

Sq. Yd.

Evans*Black b y  Arm strong

PRINT PARADE
•A Colorful Collection of Designer Prints 
From Evans-Black Carpets 

•Extra dense, level loop construction means 
rugged durability and easy care —  Especially 
well suited for all active ares of the home.

Regular

* 12“ 9
•7.00

Armstrong

CUSHION VINYL LINOLEUM r~
4x6 to 12x20

CARPET & LINOLEUM REMNANTS

50
Sq. Yd.

... 495
Sq. Yd.

A A c  &UP
Sq. Yd.

SMITH CARPETS
1289 Clarksville 785-6491
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;Mrr. Cleone Sullivan has 
moved to Alileiie from 
Bogata and requests a 
change of address on her 
nfews.
■ Mrs. Alma Lowry spent 
Monday with her brother Mr. 
and Mrs. Avret Smith of Mt. 
Pleasant, Mr. Smith is 
unimproved.

Bogota Personals
Mrs. Jettie Minshew had 

as visitors Sunday her 
cousins Ray Glenn Denison 
of Carrollton and Mrs. Zelma 
Hockley of Plainview. They 
had attended a family 
reunion at Woodland.

Mmes. Britt Lassiter, 
William Rozell, Helen 
Williams and Leon Hud-

ladies b l o u s e s  1/2 p r i,.  

Group lodies SUMMER DRESSES

Price

Men's

SPORT SHIRTS

ea.

Lot p ie c e  g o o d s

79
yd.

TURNER'S
DRY GOODS

. BOGATA, TEXAS

dies ton spent the weekend in 
Ozark Folk Center, Mt. 
View, Ark., where they 
enjoyed Country 
Western Music.

Weekend visitors of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leon Provence 
were his son Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Provence and grand­
sons Cody and Chris of 
Amarillo. Other visitors 
were Mrs. Jo Gordon and 
Mrs. Lilly Massey and Bob.

Mr. and Mrs. Woody 
Culpepper spent part of last 
week with his son Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Culpepper and 
Roger and his grandson Mr. 
and Mrs. Kim Culpepper of 
Waco and her dau^ter Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Brooks and 
daughters of Garland. They 
were accompanied home by 
Jenifer and Janie Brooks for 
a visit.

David Craddock of 
Salinas, Calif, visited part of 
this week with his sister Mrs. 
Ruth Wood They visited 
Monday with Mrs. Gladys 
Craddock of Paris. He flew 
into Houston and visited 
relatives ther and also in 
Longview.

Sunday visitors of Mrs. 
Roy Prater were her sister 
Dr. and Mrs. Frank Dorsey 
of Mesquite, her sister Mrs. 
Elstelle Clark of Dallas is 
spending a while with Mrs. 
Prater.

Weekend guests of Mrs. 
Agnes Leggett were Mr. and 
Mrs. Robin Fortenberry of 
Lockney who also visited her 
aunt Mrs. J.L. Evans at Red 
River Haven. Other guests

were her son Dean Leggett 
and Kristi of Denison. Mrs. 
Leggett accompanied her 

and granddaughterTeiry Adams 
of Terry to Denison Friday to 
pick up her children who had 
been visiting their grand­
parents Mr. and Mrs. Dean 
Leggett.

Recent guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Darcy Cage were Mrs. 
Dora Wright of Garland, 
Garland Murray of Wylie 
and Mr. and Mrs. Steve 
Savage and Steve of 
Nacogdoches.

Guests this week of Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond Mauldin 
are his sister Mr. and Mrs. 
Ted Terry and Mr. and Mrs. 
Freddie Rainwater of Slaton 
and Katy and Christ! Lintz 
of Lubbock.

Mrs. Maris Cooper Rowe 
of Clinton, S.C. spent a few 
days with Mrs. Rosie Cooper 
and Mr. and Mrs. Leroy 
Lewis. She aiso visited her 
brother Mutt Cooper of 
Killeen.

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Darcy Cage are her sisters 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Carrington of La Mirada, 
Calif and Mrs. Grace Hubble 
of Garland. Her mother Mrs. 
J.C. Douglas of McKinney 
will return home after a 
several weeks visit.

Walter King was tran­
sferred Tuesday to a Paris 
hospital. His daughter 
Martha Seitz and son-in-law 
Charles Whistler of Dallas 
are attending him and 
visiting Mrs. King.

4 AND 5 YEAR OLDS— 
Gavin Barnett, Clint 
Franks, Greg Henry, Eric

Hall and Susan Smith 
with their teacher, Mrs. 
Barbara Russell and

helpers, Mandy Dixon 
and Greg Russell studied 
about “ God’ s Love” . 
During craft period they 
made a wishing well.

Kathy Brooks
Honored With Rice Bag Party

The home of Mrs. Johnnie 
Buckman was the scene of a 
brunch and rice bag party 
honoring Kathy Brooks, 
bride elect of Charlie 
Kimmey of Lufkin. Saturday 
morning July 18. Co- 
liostesses were Mrs. Joyce 
Buckman and Mrs. Ginger 
Foster.

The serving table was 
covered with a beige lace 
tablecloth centered with an

arrangement of spring 
flowers. Fresh fruit was 
served from a watermelon 
basket. Silver accessories 
held cinnamon rolls, fresh 
apple bread, date nut 
muffins and sausage balls.

Guest were Mrs. E.E. 
Brooks, Mrs. Tra'is Hale, 
Mrs. Joe T. Kelsey, Staci 
Brooks, Becky Brooks, 
Sandy Simmons, Mrs. 
Kenneth Jeffery, Mrs. Greg

Guest, Mrs. Sam McConnell, 
Betty Lou Geese, Mary 
Fortner, Debbie Hare, 
Denise Ward, Lori Gordon, 
Judy Via, and Joann Stub­
blefield.

The couple will be married 
July 25.

^ a v e  a
nice weekend..

*

When The Heat 
Gets You Down 

Cool Off With Air Conditioners
From

D & S TOOL HARDWARE & FURN.

In Bogota.
8000 up to 24,000 BTU.

D&STOOL HARDWARE & 
FURNITURE
Ace Hardware

Birthday Party 
Honors Franks

Clint Franks, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ricky Franks of 
Wilkerson celebrated his 
fourth Wrthday July 11 at his 
home with a party. At­
tending were: Nancy and 
Amy Hervey, Rosie and 
Susie Hale, Nancy and Jack 
Brown, Becky Stroud, Greg, 
Kim, Caroline and Kristen: 
Crabb, Jerry and Jacki? Via, • 
Janice Franks and Shirley 
Hervey.

Superman cake and punch 
were enjoyed by all. Clint is , 
the grandson of Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Franks and Mr. and 
Mrs. l^mmy Hervey.

I  B I R T O ^
Proud parents of a 91b. 2 

oz. baby boy, born June 3, 
1981 and named Stefan 
Dewayne are Steve and Jerri 
Cannon of Clarksville. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Ogg, Bogata; Mr. 
Gerald Randolph, Sulphur 
Springs; Mrs. Alma Cannon, 
Irving; Mr. Donnie Cannon, 
C u t h a n d .  G r e a t -  
grandparents are Mrs. H.M. 
Barnard, Johntown; Mr. and 
Mrs. E.L. Lawson, Sulphur 
Springs; Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Green, Cuthand; and 
Mrs. Laraine Brown, Lub­
bock.

Whitney
Honored

Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Goodson honored their son, 
Schayne Whitney with a 
swimming party at Dellwood 
Park Saturday afternoon 
July 15, celebrating his 13th 
birthday.

A white cake decorated in 
the western theme centered 
with a chocolate horses head 
and a red velvet cake with 
cool aid were served to the 
following: Heather, Katy 
and Samuel Ross, Kenny 
Sanford, Rhonda and Susan 
Grissom, Bobby, Rodney, 
Marty and Randy Forsyth, 
Tommy Anderson, Mr. and 
Mrs. Goodson and Woody 
and the honoree.

Boycott
Nineteenth-century farm­

ers on Ireland’s Achill Isl­
and refused to pay rent to a 
land agent named Boycott, 
giving birth to the term for 
such acts o f  defiance.

117Main mwvw Bogota

TEACHERS Mrs. Joan

Garlic Flavor
A quick way to give bar­

becue fare a garlic flavor is 
to toss garlic cloves on the 
coals while meat grills.

Weatherall and 
Franks studied

Learn About the Bible’ ’ 
with the 6 and 7 year old

class. Their crafts were 
recipe holders.

Johntown News
1st N otice — Public Hearing

NOTICE OF TA X INCREASE 
The Talco-Bogata I.S.D. proposes

to increase your property taxes by twelve 
percent.

A public hearing on the increase will be 
held on Augusts, 1981  , at [7:30]
P.M. in Rivercrest High School

Route 1 , iBogata, Texas.

The Talco-Bogata t I.S.D. Board of Trustees
has considered the proposal and voted in a 
meeting of the School Board
as follows:*

FOR the proposal to increase tax rate:
John M. Ward, Board President 
Dr. EL EL Brooks, Board Member.
Kenneth Jeffery, Board Member 
Gene Smith, Board Member 

AGAINST the proposal to increase tax rate: 
None

ABSENT and not voting:
A. D. Stephenson Jerry R ussell

Donald Jones

^Designate by tide the member who serves as chair­
man or president of the governing body.

By Mrs. Francis Foster
John Wesley White of Ft. 

Worth and grandson David 
of Denver, Colo, spent from 
Tuesday until Friday in the 
home of Ruby Pirtle.

Mr. and Mrs. James Pirtle 
of Hurst visited over the 
weekend with his aunt Effie 
Oliver.

Kenny Foster of Bridges 
Chapel Community spent

with his 
Dorothy

Friday night 
grandm other 
Foster.

Mrs. K.O. Shoulders is a 
patient in Red River County 
Hospital.

Rev Billy Daniels is the 
speaker this week in the 
Argo Missionary Baptist 
Church near Mt. Pleasant.

Brenda and Rosie Coursey 
of Sulpher springs visited

last week with their sister 
Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Hinson.

Tammy Steward of 
Avinger and Jessie Watts of 
Talco visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. R(Hmie Steward.

HAPPY
BIRTHDAY!

GRANNY
WRIGHT

Jimmy & Wanda 
Henley

Charlotte, Jason, & 
Jimonne

Showers Honors 
Jeremy Lynn Jones

A baby shower was given 
recently in the home of Mrs. 
Glenda Shelton honoring 
Jeremy Lynn Jones and his 
mother Mrs. Terry Jones.

Co-hostesses were: Trade 
Clements, Nelda Anderson, 
Terrie Williams, Lenna 
Brown, Lisa Gaddis and 
Jeannie Bradshaw.

Pink, blue and yellow 
streamers and balloons 
decorated the living room. 
The table, covered in a white 
cloth held pink and blue cake 
carrying out the baby theme 
with the letters

Child Mauled 
By Pet

Jay Graham, 15 month old 
son of Rick and Lisa (Gotten) 
Graham of Midland was 
mauled by the family dog 
recently when he attempted 
to pet the dog while he was 
eating. The five year old 
Husky turned and attacked 
the child fracturing the 
child’s palate and ripped 
open his eye lid. After oral 
surgery and other repair 
work Jay was reported to be 
doing fine.

Jay's grandparents are 
former Talco residents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dan Gotten of 
Midland and great- 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. J.A. Davis of Talco.

Hospital News
Walter King is a patient at 

Red River General Hospital 
with pneumonia and a 
broken hip that he suffered 
Saturday when he fell at 
home.

“ Congratulation Mother’ ’ in 
spun sugar. Pineapple 
punch, nuts and mints were 
served. Glenda Shelton 
presided at the refreshment 
table.

The many nice gifts were 
displayed in the bedroom.

Out of town guests were 
T ra d e  Clemmons of 
Blossom and Terri Williams 
of Bogata.

BOGATA
CHURCH 

OF
Classes For CHRIST 
All Ages.

VAC ATIO N  BIBLE SCHOOL 
Mon. Ju ly 27 - 7:30 p.m.

Thru
Fri. Ju ly 31

[shortening CRISCO 31b. $229
INSTANT POTATOES o e N . , c  <

MIRACLE WHIP $]19

DISHWASHING LIQUID Down

CORN TEA PINTOBEANS
„ r  3 / $ i $ 1 6 9 $ 1 0 9
STYLE 1with Goblet 1  ̂ LD. ■

MILK BISCUITS OLEO
o o , $ 0 0 9 2/ 39’ 39’

mwmmmMm •

m
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Want Ads
CLARKSVILLE LIVESTOCK 

EXCHANGE Hwy 82W est

SELLING CAH LE , HCX5S, SHEEP, GOATS & HORSES 

EVERY WEDNESDAY 12:30
REGULAR HORSE SALE EVERY 2nd and 4th M ONDAY 

NIGHTS BEGINNING JULY 27th.
Jim  McQuary Barn Phone 427-5649 Home 427-5240

Bill M cGuire Home 966-2243 
Ricky M inter (Horse Soles ) 697-3366

Baeh MKug H m tf
Mt. PlMsaRt, TfK.^

GARAGE SALE-D ebbi 
Currin’s on Trail St., 

Deport. Lots of good items. 
Bunk beds, bedroom suite, 
d i s h w a s h e r ,  was h i ng  
machine, other furniture and 
much more. Fri. and Sat.

YARD SALE-Ttiursday and 
Friday 306 3rd N.E. 

B o g a t a .  7 - 2 3

GARAGE SALE-513 N.
Howison, Bogata, Thur­

sday Saturdy, Furniture and 
M i s c e l l a n e o u s .  7-23

SIX FAMILY Garage Sale, 
Sat. July 25 8:00 12:00 a.m. 

Home of Sandra Stockton, 
Alameda Dr., Bogata. 7-23

SPEIR & Speir Upholstery 
now open. All work 

guaranteed. Prompt service. 
149 N. Main, Bogato. 632-4535 
or 4484. tfc

H E L P  W A N T E D —PUBLIC NOTICE 
The Board of Equalization Information on Alaskan 

of the City of Talco will meet and overseas employment. 
Thursday July 30,1981 at the Great Income. Call (602) 941- 
City Hall from 9 a.m. to 11 8014. Phone call refundable, 
a.m. 7-23

Good Selection Of

Double Wides On Display
Different Decors and Flocr Plans 

Come See How Much House 
Your Money Will Buy 

And Discover Why More People 
Are Buying Manufactured Housing 

All Homes Priced To Sell 
Located On Ferguson Road 

324 Ferguson Rd. 572-S658

Open Your Own Retail 
Apparel Shop. Offer The 
Latest In Jeans, Denims 
A nd S p o r t s w e a r .  
$14,850.00 Includes In­
ventory, Fixtures, Etc. 
Complete Store! Open In 
As Little As 2 Weeks 
Anywhere In U.S.A. (Also 
Infants And Childrens 
Shop). Call SUE, TOLL 
FREE 1-800-874-4780.

Obituaries
 ̂ Sara Ann Burgess

Sara Ann Burgess of 
Clarksville died Saturday at 
Red River General Hospital.

Services for Mrs. Brugess 
were held Mmday at the 
lindeman Chapel of the 
Clarksville Funeral Home 
with the Rev. Sam Rice and 
the Rev. A.B. Kdlam of­
ficiating. Burial followed at 
the Bogata C^emetery.

I  Mrs. Burgess was bom 
*  Nov. 24, 1917 in Red River 

County, the daughter of 
William Henry and Eleanor 
Chesshire Keith. She resided 
in Red River (bounty for all 
her life. She married E.G. 
Burgess in Oklahoma on 
July 14, 1940.

Survivors include her 
husband; one daughter, Jan 
Burgess of GarksviUe; two 
sisters, Lucille Williams, of 
Grand Island, Neb. and 
Billie Gaye Nolan, of 
Clarksville; one brother, 
John N. Keith, of Houston 
and two grandchildren.

Lyon Francis
Lyon Francis, 77, of El 

Paso died there F ri^y.
Fdlowing cremation in El 

Paso, graveside services 
were held on Monday in 
Bogata Cemetery with 
Deacon John Dunn of Oiu* 
Lady of Vict« 7  Catholic 
(Church in Paris officiating.

Surviving are a son, 
Robert Francis (rf Campbell, 
(Talif.; a daughter, Betty 
Rose Wilkerson of El Paso; 
four grandchildren and a 
sister. Miss Marie Francis of 
Orange, Calif.

CARD OF THANKS 
Thanks fw  the prayers, 

cards, calls and each kind­
ness shown me while I was in 
the hospital and since I have 
been home.

Agnes Guess

SAVE YOURSELF MONEY!!
We G m  Clean W heat, Clover, 

Rye Grass, Most Anything. 
The Cost Is For Below 

That O f Commercial Plonting Seed
Contoct Thomas Nichols Or 
Call 652-5823 or 652-4205

Nichols Seed Cleaning
Deport

r RODGERS-WADE {
Manufacturing {
Custom Cabinets ^  

Counter Tops Stock Cobinets J
Availoble Hnished Or Unfinished w 

Complete Line Of Roper Applionces ^  

FREE ESTIMATES ^
Coll Collect (214)785-1619 Or Come ^

By0urDisployRoomAtl4013rdS.W. M

KOEHNBACKliei
A T R E B IC H iN C

W AU R , SEWER & R E O R IC  UNES 
SEPTIC TANK SYSniWS 

EQUIPPED TO SERVE YOUR AREA 
FREE ESTIMATES

Alton Koehn 
674-5471, to r o it ,T x .

CUSTOM DRAPERY SHOP
Talco 379-6431

ALL BEAUTIFUL NEW SAMPLE BOOKS OF 
LATEST DESIGNS IN DRAPERY FABRIC

20% Off July 20 Through August On

Drapery & Lining Fabric
ALL NEW SAMPLES OF CARPET 

ALSO ARMSTRONG VINYL & HARD SURFACE FLOORING

NEW SHIPMENT WOVEN WOOD 
PICK UP, TAKE HOME

25% And M ore Off

Jerry Day, Jr.
Sawices for Jerry Wayne 

Day, Jr. of Paris were held 
July 6th at Steele and 
Thomas Funeral Home 
CTiapel with the Rev. Gail 
Graves officiating, with 
burial in Meadowbrook 
Clemetery.

Day was bom Nov. 7, 1958 
in Paris, the son of Jerry 
Wayne Day, Sr. and Carolyn 
Fay Foster. He attended 
Pattonville Schools and lived 
in the home of his late 
grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
Herman Day for several 
years.

SurvivOT's are his wife, 
Talonda whom he married 
on June 27, 1961, his father 
M. Sgt (Ret) Jerry W. Day 
a*., of Pottsboro, Texas, his 
mother, now Mrs. Carolyn 
Lester of Paris, two sisters, 
Brenda and Cathy Lester, 
four brothers, Michael and 
Danny Lester, Eddy Day 
Mercer, and Gary Scott Day 
of Pottsboro. He was a 
nephew of James and Calvin 
Day both of Pattonville.

CARD OF THANKS 
Thanks to the Bogata 

Rodeo Association fw  the 
concession stand at the rodeo 
and to those who helped and 
patronized the stand to make 
it a success.

McOury Cemetery 
Association

CARD OF THANKS 
The Family of Martha 

Goode acknowledges with 
deep appreciation the kind­
ness and expressions of 
sympathy shown during our 
time of grief. Thank You.

CARD OF THANKS 
Thanks for the cards, 

flowers, calls, prayers and 
other kindness shown me 
while in the hospital and 
since I have been home.

Mrs. T.A. York

CARD OF THANKS 
Thanks for the prayers, 

cards, flowers and kind­
nesses shown me while I was 
in the hospital.

Lena Powell 
PARIS

READY BUILT 
HOMES

Hwy 271 North 2 miles 
214-785-1480 
214-785-6187 

ALL HOMES ARE COM 
PLETELY FINISHED AND 
DELIVERED TO YOUR 
LOT. READY TO MOVE 
^ I I

3 Bedroom, 2 Bath, 
Beautiful Bay Window, 
Central Heat and Air, 
Dishwasher, Attic Fan, 
Stove with Clock, 
Automatic Timer and 
Continous Cleaning Oven, 
Fully Insulated, Sculp­
tured Carpet, Custom 
Built Birch Cabinets, 
Utility Room with Washer 
and Dryer Clonnections, 
Large Living Area. 
12’ x l 5 ’ B e d r o o m s ,  
Telephone (^nections. 
$26,500

WE OFFER FINANCING 
TO QUALIFIED BUYER. 

Open 8:00-5.00-Mor -Fri.
9:00-12:00-Sat. 

or call for appointment

AUCTION!
Sof. Nite, Hwy. 37 N., Bogota 

7:00 p.m.
FURNITURE, GLASSWARE, HARDWARE, 

|T00LS,GR0CERIES & VARIOUS OTHER ITEM!
Licensed and Bonded Lie. No. TXS-012-0650

T R A C T O R  PULL
IN PARIS •

F R ID A Y  & S A T U R D A Y  
JU L Y  24 & 25
NW LOOP 286 

7:30 P.M . EACH EVENING
New Facilities - 300 Ft. Track - New Classes

*9,300 PURSE
Stock - Superstock - Modified

SPECIAL FEATURES
4 Wheel Drive Pulling t r u c k s  

Antique Tractors

TICKET INFORMATION
Advanced —  A d u lt s ....................................$4.00
Children 6-12 ................................................$2.00
At the G a te  —  A d u lt s ........  .....................$5.00
Children 6-12 ................................................$3.00«

Tickets a v a ila b le  from  a  young  fa rm er, Ipcal* 
im p lem en t d e a le r , or at the gate.

Sponsorw t by

PARIS YOUNG FARMERS

FOR SALE-Two bedroom 
house in South Park on 
Cypress Springs Lake. One 
bath, Circle Drive, paved, '/2 

acre lot. Water view. Call 
214-860-2369. (47-ltc)

MALE PUPPY, 3 to 4 mon­
ths old, short hair, hazel 
eyes, web feet. Good disposi­
tion, healthy, good pet for 
children. Will make a large 
dog. Free to good home. Call 
537-2228. (47-tfc)

FOR SALE
3 Bedroom Frame 
House, Acre Lot, 
Shop Building,

16X30, Hwy. 271 

South, Bogota.

Coll 632-4316

Dirt Work Land Clearing

2 ^  &  2 ^  C l o n i t z a c t i o n
Rt. One Bogata, Tex.

Bulldozer Dragline Dump Trucks
Jackie Dodd 214-632-4441

214-632-5185W.T. Dodd 
M.J. Dodd 214-632-5757

ooDmen
F Q in i L I E S

enjoy special life insurance 
proreaion ro meet eoch fomily's 

needs We know your needs 
ore very speciol ond we con 

answer them.

Franklin W. Herring 
Deport, Tex. 
Ph. 652-6972

■ rioN

WOODMEN OF INE WORLD 
LIFE INSURANCE SOCIEIY
HOME OFFICE: OMAHA, NEBRASKA 
"The FAMILY FRATERNITY"*^

Mini-Ads
FOR SALE-1964 Chevy 2-ton 

hay truck. Steel bed. Also 
cab over camper, LWB with 
jack. 652-2931. MA 8-6

WILL DO painting, or 
carpenter & repair work, 

652-9495, Deport, Jessie 
Williams. MA tfc

UNSECURED LOANS to 
$5,000 on just your 

s i g n a t u r e .  O n l y  
requirements are good 
creidit and job. Call 214-379- 
5661. MA 7-9

FOR SALE—1967 Ford 
Fairlane, good condition, 

289 V-8, 3 speed standard 
transmission. 652-4564 after 
4:30 p.m. MA 6-4

POINTERS BOOT & Shoe 
Shop repairs Men, women 

shoes, saddles. Pointers does 
it right. 146 S. Main. Bogata. 
MA tfc

FOR SALE-B Farmall 
Tractor with bedders and 

cultivator, also rabbits, also 
1969 Dodge Polara, Call 652- 
2782. MA 8-6

FOR RENT-two bedroom, 
one bath and shower house 

on FM 410 near Fulbright. 
Contact Gus Bryant at 652- 
6765. MA 8-6

A R C H E R ’ S H O U S E  
LEVELING and Foun­

dation Repair. Fix dragging 
doors. Work Guaranteed. 
Free estimates. Call 785-5829 
or 982-5422. MA tfc

FOR SALE—commo-cial
buildings and lots 'in 

Bogata. Garrison Real. 
Eastate. 632-4346 or 632-5307. 
tfc

IN TALCO, BOGATA and 
surrounding area—Formal! 

your plumbing needs call; 
Rose Enterprises, 379-4531,. 
Talco. MA tfc

BOBBIE’S BAKE SHOP— 
Can furnish the best in 

wedding, birthday or an­
niversary cakes, (xes, baked 
fresh. Call 652-3803.''-4-2

GARDEN WORK—Custom 
discing, flat breaking, 

bedding and shredding. 632- 
5369 or 632-5032. MA tfc

FOR SALE—3 bedroom 2 
bath brick home by owner, 

fireolace, many extras, 632- 
5324, Bogata. MA tfc

D E T R O I T  M e a t  
Processing—Custom 

killing, processing, and 
wrapping. Also feed lot beef 
available. 674-6911 or 674- 
5712. MA tfc

FOR SALE-two bediYXxn, 
one bath Fram house 2V̂  

Acres, Garrison Real Elstate; 
632-4346 (X* 5307. MA 4-26

LIKE A GOOD Neighbor, 
State Farm is there. For 

car, home, life and health 
insurance ca ll: Harold
Sheppard, 401 E. Main, 
Clarksville. 427-5614 after 
5:00, 427-3923. MA 9t

FOR SALE—Cab over 
cam per. Imperial 71 

Model. Sleeps 4. Stove, ice 
box, sink and table, tie 
downs included. Call 652- 
4564. MA 7-30

CUSTOM Hay Baling. Call 
652-2931. Mike Bove. MA 

tfc

CERAMICS BY DORRIS—f 
mile West of Taylcrtown. 

Supplies, free lessons. Open 
Tuesday and Thursday 2-6 
p.m. Sat. 12:30-3:30 p.m. CaU 
785-2070. 4-9

FOR SALE—large round 
bales of hay. Fertilized 

and non-fertilized. Bogata, 
632-4442. MA 8-6

FOR SLAE—large 6 drawer 
desk adding machine, 

artificial fireplace with 
electric heater. 652-4631. MA 
7-30

F O R  S A L E — F a r m a l l  
tractor, disc and more. 

632-5341. Bogata. MA 7-30

FOR RENT—2 bedroom 
house, 1st S.W. Bogata, 

$125 per month, $50 deposit, 
572-2176. MA 7-30

FOR SALE—2 bedroom 
frame house, ^  lot , 20x24 

metal shop, deep well, 
cyclone fence, Johntown, 
call 632-5672 for ap­
pointment. 7-30

ROSALIE LODGE No. 527 
stated meetings on fourth 

Thursday of each month at 
8:00 p.m. MA tfc

RED RIVER INS Agency, 
Home-Farm & Ranch-Life- 

Term  L ife -C om m ercia l 
Bldgs. Disability, Frank 
Herring. 652-6972. MA tfc

THANKS to all of my friends 
for making 1981 my best 

year ever. Frank Herring. 
MA tfc

GERMANIA FARM Mutual 
Ins. Home-Farm-Ranch. 

Frank Herring, 652-6972. MA 
tfc

.1 DO CARPENTER wort, 
plumbing, yard work, 

garden w « ‘k, fence building, 
rem ove dead trees, 
ANYTHING. 632-5903. MA 
tfc

FOR SALE-1972 Ford 
pickup, Galen Legate, 632- 

5963, BogaU MA 8-6

WANTED-Baby Sitting in 
your home Monday- 

Thursday, 632-5737, Bogata. 
M A 8 - 6

FOR S A L E -F ertilized  
(Coastal and Yudii Clover, 

Large round 800-1000 lbs. $15 
per. Hubo*t Hoen, 632-5962, 
Bogata. MA 8-6

FOR SALE-Used Lumber, 
2x8, 2x4 flooring, shiplap, 

prehung doors, with facing, 
fram es. 632-5040, Bogata. 
M A 8 - 6

FOR SALE-5 room house, 
double carport, 200x100 ft. 

lot, chain link foice, 632-5669 
or 4332, Bogata. MAtfc.

JIM BOND—632-4408 is 
buying house furniture and 

appliances or anything of 
value MA tfc

SHOP SLATON Furniture 
for furniture, appliances, 

carpet, vinyl floor coverings^ 
Quality at Money-Savings 
IMoesI MA tfc

FEEDER k  STOCKER 
Heifers k  Steers. Brah­

man-Cross replacement 
heifers. Norris Ballard, 
Paris, Tx. 214-785-0192, 
after 9 p.m. MA tfc

CALL MRS. BEN WARREN 
for all your flower needs. 

Robinius Greenhouse, 652- 
2211. MA tfc

FOR SALE—Large 2 stwy 
brick building, comer lot, 

N. Main, Bogata, Garrison 
Real Estate, 632-4346 or 5307. 
MA tfc

FOR SALE!—’Two black k  
white female hound pups, 4 

white Uutledoves, 632-5151, 
BogaUi. MA 7-23__________
FOR SALE—Bermuda Hay, 

baled or standing, 
preferably standing, O.E. 
Barnard, 632-5288, Bogata. 
MA 7-23

L O S T — B l ond  C o c k e r
Spaniel, answers to name 

of Buffi. If found call 652-6300 
or 6963. MA 7-23.

FOR SALE—CX Honda 500 
3500 miles, 632-4142 after 4 

p.m. MA 7-23

FOR SALE}—Extra nice 2 
bedroom fram e home, 

Bogata, close in, 632-4346, 
632-5307, Garrison Real 
Estate. MA 6-11_________

FOR SALE>-Pioneer 2270 
chain saw, good shape, 632- 

5993, J.F. Varner, Bogata. 
MA7-30

FDR SALE—Good cabinet 
Singer sewing machine.. 

Call 632-4128, Bogata MA 7-30

RETTIRED cou|de looking for 
house to rent. Call Lee 

Langston 632-5351, Bogata. 
MA 7-30

STRAYED—3 year old Black 
Angus bull pasture at 

the house, call Ina Lou 
White, 532-5740 or 5351, 
Bogata. MA 7-30

Need appliance repair? Call 
Lowry’s in Mr. Vernon fo r . 

factory trained servicemen' 
for all brands of home ap- 
piieances. Phone 537-2214 of 
537-2213. Nights, holidays 
end weekends call 588-2664. 
TFC
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Woodall’s Hold Reunion 
At Nursing Home

The Woodall family 
reunion was held Sunday, 
July 5, at Red River Haven 
Nursing Home in Bogata. 
Hie guest of honor was Mrs. 
Maggie Woodall Franks 
Pendergraft, 97, who, with 
her husband, £>onald, is a 
resident of the nursing home. 
Attending were Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Singleton, and 
granddaughter, Ruth Ann 
Hodge; Mrs. Frances 
Martin, Brenda Bates, and 
son, Chris, all of Lubbock; 
Mrs. Colleen Cleghorn and

WANTED RN’S 
OR LVN’S

Franklin County 
Hosptial 
Contact

Judy Yarbrough 
Director Of 

Nursing Services 
537-4552

daughter, Sherra, from 
Dallas; Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Eklmonds and Larry, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bobby Edmonds, 
Mrs. Cindy Scott and Wendy, 
Alvin Turkett and Mrs. 
Marvin Turkett, and Misti 
Ann Wood, all of Vernon; 
Mr. and Mrs. Willie Gnffin, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roger Griffin, 
Monica and Patricia of 
Paris; Mrs. Anthony Griffin, 
Janney and Elisa, Mrs. 
Deborah Lynn Burnett, 
Jason and Dale cf 
Sacremento, Calif.; Jo Ann 
and Christ! Williams of 
Cunningham; Mr. and Mrs. 
Duane King, Kristi and Kala 
of Paris; Mr. and Mrs. 
Danny Eudy, Adam and 
Aaron, Mr. and Mrs. Horace 
Adams, Monte and Randy, 
Mrs. Maude Condra, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Newlin Gurley of 
Bogata.

BOGATA BUSINESS 
DlltEaORY

have a 1 
I n ice M/eekend...j

CAMP BOUND—a group 
from the First Baptist 
Church and their spon­
sors ready to leave for 
camp last week at Daniel 
Springs near Gary.

PREPARATION H
Ointment

2 oz. Size

$264

DIETAC
Once A Day 

Max.
Strength ^ J O O
Diet Capsules 20 Ct.

DI-GEL
Liquid < 2 5 712 oz. Size f l

BACTINE
Hydrocortisone

$ 1 2 7
Skin Creme ®

SACCHARIN
Norwich

O T 4
500 O . j P  g

TYLENOL
REG. STRENGTH 

Capsules

lOO's

50's

79

13

RHULICAINE
SPRAY

FOR RELIEF 

OF SUNBURN $ 0 3

WAL-MART PHARMACY
Bill Bryson, Pharmacist C la rksv ille

Carving a new  nam e

fo r a dependable fu ture.

Changing a name is not easy, but after 45 
years of continued growth and service, 
Community Public Service Company’s name 
Just doesn’t fit anymore. The new name, 
Tbxaa-New Mexico Power Company helps 
you to know more about the company, by 
knowing the area we serve. You’ll still get 
the same dependable service, and can pay 
your bills at the same address. Tbxas-New 
Mexico Power Company, a new name for 
old reliable.

Texas-NewAAexico 
P o w e r C o m p a n y

Maple Springs Homecoming 
Draws Large Crowd

M a p l e  S p r i n g s  
Homecoming was well at­
tended on July 4. A superb 
job of planning the covered 
dish event goes to the 
following outgoing officers; 
M.L. Black, President; 
Mary McKelvey, Vice- 
President; Janie Wilson, 
Secretary; Nina Harbour, 
Treasurer; Charline Black, 
Reportei and Wilma Fry, 
Building Fund Chairman.

Following the visiting and 
a delicious meal a business 
meeting was called to order 
by M.L. Black, President 
Lois Moore gave the history, 
and Mary M cKelvey 
presented a plat of 
the homes in the school 
distret in years past and 
present.Officers elected for 
1982 are; Alford H. 
Flanagen,  Pres ident ;  
Charles Graf, Vice- 
President; Frankie Pitts, 
Secretary; Nina Harbour, 
Treasurer; Merl Burton, 
Reporter and Wilma Fry, 
Building Fund Chairman.

Registering were: M.L.
and Charline (Pittman) 
Black, Birdie Blalock, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Riddle, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lloyd Mayfield, 
Mr. and Mrs. R.M. Vaughn, 
Lex'etta Harris, Lois Moore, 
Alice (Oliver) Deaton, Nina 
Harbour, Opal McAnally,  
Nola (Pittman) Reynolds, 
Jackie Kirkland, Dicky 
Miller, Andy and Irma 
Bowman, Raymond and 
Lucille Matthews, Hal and 
Tincy (Pittman) Strahan, 
Frankie (Pittman) Pitts, 
Randy Pitts, Adam Tucker, 
Tessie (Jackson) Ferguson, 
Gerri (Ferguson) Cutler, Lin 
Cwy and daughters, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Shields, Virgie 
Graf,  Morris and Hazel 
Scott, Otis MePeters, Mrs. 
John Lee, Alford and Mary 
Flanagan, Billy Wayne 
Flanagan, Mr. and Mrs. 
Alford L. Flanagan, AI and 
Marie, Budy and Ola 
Robertson, Cilff and Blanche 
Phillips, Sue (Phillips) 
Thames, Martha (Phillips) 
Jenkins, Sammie and Merl 
Burton, Tommy Earl Bur- 
Um, Doyce, Marilyn and 
Melinda Phillips, Chucker, 
Wanda and Katherine Graf, 
Johnny and Connie Brown, 
Mary Law and grandson 
Jim m y, Noami (Phillips) 
W i l l i a m s ,  B e l i n d a  
(Williams) Caulde, Rachel, 
Danea and Rebecca, Irene 
Caudle, Earl and Ina Mae 
(Fry)  Brooks, Luenona 
(Wilson) Blalock, Dub and 
Lois Wilson, Lorene

(Belcher)  Walter and 
Woody, Maggie Ensminger 
Walter, Cecil, Andrene 
Bevill and George, James 
Bevill, Steve Sanderegger, 
Shawn Henley, Betty 
Henley, Greg Henley, Kent 
Henley, Mary Lynn Elliott. 
Tommie Hays, Maydelle 
(Applewiiite) RerJroe, Billy 
Jack Renf'-oe, Johnnie 
(Blalock) Sparks, Mr. and 
Mrs. Huey Crooks, Bill and 
Rebecca Austin, Warren 
Belcher, Coy Pittman, Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Fry, 
Melinda Riddle, Bryant 
Blalock, Butch and Harralyn

Black, Rayford and Vera 
Pittman, Mrs. C.W. Pittman, 
Mrs. Katy (Fray) Stinson, 
J.W., Kathy and Jermie, 
Carl and Mary McKelvey, 
Billy Joe Randle, Tommy 
Mitchell, Carl and Barbara 
(Graf) Smith, Arthur Smith, 
Marvin C. Bevill, Odeatha 
( S m i t h )  A n d e r s o n ,  
Chokeetah (Smith) Tully, 
Vertie (Blalock) Wilbanks, 
Morris and Exa MePeters, 
Bill and Edith Graf, Jane 
and John, Red Logan, 
Ronnie Joe, Lynn, Joe and 
Bill Holloway, Verbeth 
Wyatt, and CIhristine Pitt­
man.

Talco O. E. S.
Holds Evening Meeting

Talco Clhapter No. 846, 
Order of the Eastern Star 
held their first meeting 
Tuesday evening with the 
new Worthy Matron and 
Patron, Ivy Smith and 
James Gieger presiding. 
Only two protems, Mrs. 
Rufene Cook protemed for 
Associate Matron and Mrs 
Beunah Hamilton as Ruth 
were needed. Mrs. Hamilton 
was appointed to fill the 
station of Ruth and was 
installed by Marshall, Lottie 
Via.

Mrs. Opal Morris read 
greetings from the Grand 
Worthy Matron and 
Patron and a letter from the 
Founder’s Day Committee to 
be held at Arlington the last 
of August and voted to send 
.10 cents per member to help 
with the expenses of the 
celebration and to make 
Talco 100 per cent on the 
project.

Indepedance Day was 
observed by the presentation 
of the U.S. Flag by Mrs. 
Lottie Via afterwhich the 
pledge of allegiance was 
given. Mrs. Smith read the 
orgin of the Flag which was 
followed by the singing of 
“ America The Beautiful”  
Mrs. Colean Dixon gave a 
beautiful renention of the 
secret work. Mrs. Bobbie 
Giddens gave her treasurers 
report which was adopted.

It was voted to have a 
salad supper at the next 
meeting in August in 
memory of Rob Morris’s 
birthday. Everyone is to 
bring a salad. Being no 
futher business, Capter was 
closed by singing the new

closing od e ,“ Beyond the 
Sunset”  and the retiring .

Lovely refreshments were 
served of sandwiches, dips 
and chips, coffee and soft 
drinks in the kitchen by 
hostesses, Mrs. Rufene Cook 
and Mrs. Bobbie Giddens.

1 Rad River 
1 Counry 

PuMcUbrary1 Me^, Wed., THurr., FrI. 1 12:00-S:30 p.m.1 Tuee., 9:00-12:00 o.m. 1 1:00-5:30 p.m.1 Sotwrdov. 9:00 o.m.- 
1 12:00 noon

MT. VERNON 
TRADE DAY 1 
AUCTION 1

Every Sat. at 7 o.m. 1 
.ocated 2 Miles Nortn 

Of Mt. Vernon 1 
On Hwy. 37 1

Cal. Buddy Stringfellaw, 1 
Auctianeer. 1 

A lsa  Ava ilab le  - 1 
Daars and Trim 1 

James Diggs, Ph. 632-45051
1 D & S TOOL MASONHARDWARE and 

FURNITURE CO SHOES 11 See Us Far Your For Men I
LAWN & GARDEN SUPPLIES

Mawers-Tillers- And Women. I
Hoes-Rakes-Etc.

|117 Main Street Bagoto, Tex

Call 632-4230 Or 1 
See John W. Hood. |

THIS SPACE THIS SPACE
CAN MAKE CAN MAKE

lYOU MONEY! YOU MONEY
Coll CALL

632-5322 632-5322
COUNTRY FURNITURE ARMSTRONG

We Sell New & Used PEST CONTROL
Furniture. We Buy Used Camplete Pest Cantrcl
Furniture. 1 Piece or Full

A ll Work Guranteed 

licensed TPCL 3418Hausehald. Call 427-3227
or 427-3573. Area 214. Coll Day Or Night

Dny or Night. Charles Armstrong
1807 W. Main

Clarksville, Tex. Bogota, Tx. 214-632-5925

Mini - Ads 
3 Weeks For $3

HUDDLESTON GROCERY
Main Specials Good - Thurs.. Fri., Sat.

OPEN 7 a.m. • 7 p.m. 632-5624
We Welcome Food Stamp Shoppers

bogata

HAPPY BUCK $50

SUGAR

Imperial 
5 Lb.

69

TIDE
Laundry Detergent

$]99
49 Oz. Bax

CHUCK ROAST Lb. 49

PEACH SLICES Del Mante 29 Oz. Can 79

NC-4

SPONSORED BY 
BOGATA FUNERAL HOME 

GRANDCHILD OF THE WEEK

Jennifer & Ryan Ballard
Parents are Mr. and Mrs. Mike Ballard 

of Gladewater.
Grandparents are 

Mr. and Mrs. Wilford Lowry of Blossom and 

Alvin Ballard of Clardy.
Great Grandmother is Mrs. Alma Lowry 

____ of Bogota.

1 TEABAGS
1  Generic 100 Ct.

8 9 ^

APPLES
Lb.

3 9 ’

SPAM
12 Ozs.

$ ] 3 9

BREAD BISCUITS BREAD
■  Mrs. Baird's Sta-Fresh Parade S American Maid Wonder Country Style

5 9 ’ 2/ 39” 4 9 ’
CRISCO SHORTENING 3 Lb. Can $219

TOILET TISSUE Chormin 4 Rail Pk. 09

CANNED DRINKS AM Flavars 
6 Pack Hat $189

FRYERS
Lb.

5 9 4

STAR KIST 
6.5 Oz. Can

TUNA
99<

MILK
Barden Gal. Jug

$ 0 0 9

PEAS
Del Mante 

17 Oz Can

2 / 8 9 9


