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Brian C. Tighe, Captain in USAF was able to safely land his Cessna 172 when 
he developed engine trouble on Tuesday, March 15th.

Postage Rates Increase
Effective A p r il 3 ,1 9 8 8

Today Postmaster General 
Anthony M. Frank announc­
ed that a decision has been 
reached by the Board of 
Governors concerning the 
proposed increase in postage 

, rates.
Effective April 3,1988, the 

new rate for first class 
postage will be 25 cents. 
This is the first increase in

postage costs in three years. 
Although no one welcomes 
an increase in postage, it 
should be placed in 
perspective. For example, in 
1932 a first class postage 
stamp cost 3 cents. With 
adjustments for inflation, 
that same stamp would cost 
25.5 cents.

The new “ E“  stamp, 
which will cost 25 cents, will 
go on sale March 23. The 
Post Office will also have an 
ample supply of 3 cents 
stamps and other postage to 
meet your mailing needs.

Remember 
To Change 
Your Clocks

Brian Tighe from the Air 
Force Academy at Colorado 
Springs recently had engine 
trouble flying to Wichita 
Falls, Texas and had to 
emergency land in Travis 
Spurlocks pasture. Brian 
safely landed the Cessna 172 
before the snow last week, 
but the plane had to be 
towed over by a 4-Wheel 
vehicle in the snow to Neal 
Spurlock’s barn by Mark 
Jackson. Neal’s barn was big 
enough to get the plane in to 
work on. Two civilian 
mechanics from Colorado 
Springs brought a new 
engine down to put in the 
plane.

Brian is originally from 
New York but has been at 
the Academy for seven 
years.

Several folks were on hand 
Friday evening to see Brain 
take off. It’s not everyday 
that a plane lands out in the 
open and several people 
enjoyed visiting and helping 
the men get the plane ready 
to fly again.

9  Candidates 
Have Filed

Nine candidates for Trust­
ee of the Stratford Indepen­
dent School Board have filed 
fo, election. With the 
deadline having been March 
23, 1988, this will be the 
sjate of candidates for the 
School Board Election on 
May 7, 1988; Johnny
Mungia, Jack Rhoades, 
Robert Randall, Linda Spur-

Cont. On Page 2

Reinart
Promoted

RICK REINART

The First State Bank of 
Stratford is proud to 
announce the promotion of 
Rick Reinart to the office of 
Vice President. Rick came to 
work for the First State Bank 
in March 1986 as an Ag Loan 
Officer.

Rick and his wife, Connie, 
have four children: Heather, 
Marcus, Jenny, and Tiffany. 
Rick is actively involved in 
our community and is 
currently serving as a 
director for the Stratford 
Lions Club and is chairman 
of the Finance Committee at 
St. Joseph’s Church. He is 
also a member and past 
director of the Stratford 
Chamber of Commerce.

Chamber Of Commerce Banquet

Linda Spurlock

The 1988 Chamber of 
Commerce Banquet was held 
Friday night, March 26th at 
the Sherman County Barn. 
There were approximately 
200 in attendance.

Headquarters Restaurant 
catered the meal. The 
Engraving was donated by 
North Texas Wholesale. 
There were nine paintings 
donated by Tri-Corner Art 
Association. Winners in that 
drawing for the paintings 
were Gaynelle Riffe, Cheryl 
Reese, Marihoward Engel- 
brecht (She won 2) Esther 
Ferguson, Scott Buckles, 
Sharon Brown, Laura Smith 
and Mary Sheehan of 
Dumas. Stratford Printing 
did the place mats that had 
the program printed on 
them. The Depot Museum 
lent the pictures for display 
that everyone enjoyed look­
ing at as they came in.

Don Riffe was the emcee

for the evening. Invocation 
was given by the Rev. David 
Harker of First Christian 
Church and the Benediction 
was given by the Rev. Bill 
Watson of the First United 
Methodist Church. For the 
evenings entertainment - 
there was a slide presenta­
tion shown by Joe Taylor.

The three big honorées for 
Citizen, Farmer and Busi­
ness person of the year were 
recognized. Presenting Bus­
iness peifeon of the Year was 
last years winners Gayland 
and Debbi Vandiver of Elk 
Pharmacy. This years recip­
ients were again a married 
couple, Betty and Baskin 
Brown, (Brown’s Meat 
Locker). Betty and Baskin 
are marriage partners as 
well as busniness partners. 
Both are descendants of 
pioneer Sherman County 
families and with the 
exception of a few years they

Betty and Baskin Brown
have spent their entire lives 
as residents of Stratford and 
Sherman County. Both 
attended Stratford Public 
Schools, were good students, 
and participated in athletics, 
Baskin in Football and 
Basketball and Betty in 
Basketball. Baskin graduat­
ed from Stratford High 
School in 1938 and Betty in 
1940. Baskin attended West 
Texas Sate University and 
Texas Tech during the years 
1938 through 1940. He then 
persuaded his parents to let 
him leave college in 1941 and 
moved back to Stratford only 
after he had obtained gainful 
employment.

In May, 1941 Betty moved 
with her mother to California 
and by September Baskin 
had followed her, finding 
employment in an aircraft 
company. They were marri­
ed on October 1941. They 
lived in San Diego their first

Jimmy Chesher
year of marriage, then with 
reclassification in his draft 
status and induction staring 
Baskin in the face, they 
promptly moved back to 
Sherman County where he 
enlisted in the Air Force and 
helped fill Sherman County 
quota of enlistments.

Upon completion of his 
military service he came 
home to his family and 
began working with his 
father in his parents grocery 
business as will as helping 
with the farming and 
ranching. The grocery store 
was sold in 1950, and then in 
February, 1955, another 
chapter in the lives of the 
family began, with the 
purchase of Stratford Frozen 
Food Lockers from George 
Allen. They operated the 
facility for 13 years at the 
Highway 54-South Wall 
location, then in October, 
1967, ground was broken for

a new, larger facility. 
Browns Meat Locker opened 
at its present location, 3A 
miles south of the city limits 
on Highway 287 on March 
21, 1968. Additional space 
and improvements were 
added to the locker in both 
1971 and again in 1974.

The couples two sons Joe 
Ray and Jim Bob, have 
worked at the plant but have 
also pursued their own 
careers in Pharmacy and 
Education, respectively Bet­
ty and Baskin have 4 
grandchildren-Blair-26, Car­
rie-24, Ashley Ann-4 and 
Caleb 6 months.

The Browns have long 
been active in community 
affairs and have been very 
charitable as evidenced by 
their donation of free 
processing of hogs donated 
to the Stratford High School 
Band for their fund-raising 
sausage sale. Also they have

NOTICE
EASTER CANTATA

HIS LAST DAYS, an 
Easter Cantata by Dallas 
Holms, will be presented by 
the Assembly of God Church 
on Easter Sunday at 6:00 
p.m. Everyone is invited to 
attend this Easter story 
presented in music.

NOTICE

A Film-
Beef Referdum will show a 
film on Channel 6 12 o’clock 
to 1 o’clock Monday through 
Friday. To be voted on May 
10th County Extension 
Office.

NOTICE

There will be a Bake Sale, 
Thursday, March 31 from 9 
a.m. to ? at Alberts, First 
State Bank and Thriftway to 
benefit the Community 
Youth Revival.

NOTICE

Stratford Chamber of 
Commerce Volleyball Tour­
nament

April 18-23
Needed

Men’s, Women’s and Mixed 
Teams.
For more information call 
Donavan Ferguson [396- 
2012] Gayland Vandiver 
[396-2528] at night or the 
Chamber of Commerce office 
at [396-2260].

If you are interested in 
running for Hospital District 
Board of Directors, you could 
begin signing up on 
Tuesday, March 8th and it 
will continue until Thursday, 
April 7th. Go by the office at 
Coldwater Manor. There are 
three vacancies to be filled. 
Terms expiring are Duane 
Pittman, Elaine Gurley and 
Barbara Chumley who was 
appointed to fill in for Roger 
Moore who resigned. Elec­
tion is on May 7th, the first 
Saturday of May 1988.

Grain Prices
Corn - «2.1«

W heat- * 2 . 5 5

Milo - *3.27

been very active in the 
development and growth of 
the Sherman County Older 
Texans, SCOT Organization 
of which he serves on the 
Board of Directors. She is a 
long-time member of Beta 
Sigma Phi Sorority and the 
Prospectus Study Club. Both 
are active in the Baptist 
Church. Baskin was distin­
guished as President of the 
American Association of 
Meat Processors, a national 
meat processers organiza­
tion, during the year 1984, 
85.

Gayland and Debbi Vandi­
ver stated that they had not 
noted the highest praise for 
these long-time business 
persons, this would come 
from their many, long-term 
satisfied customers, employ­
ees and friends, and when 
you think about it, that is 
what owning and operating a 
business is really all about.

Billy Bell last years 
Farmer of the Year present­
ed Jimmy Chesher with this 
years Award. Billy said of 
Jimmy that “ Early to Bed, 
early to rise’ ’ , aptly 
describes this Sherman 
County Farmer, and a hard 
worker to boot. He is up 

Cont. On Page 2
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Legal Notice
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LEGAL NOTICE
To Whom It May Concern: 

Stratford Hospital District 
is accepting bids through 
April 13, 1988, on the
following computer equip­
ment:
Single-User System:

Compaq 386 20 mhz 
with 60 mb Disk Drive 

40 mb Tape Drive 
1.2 mb Diskette Drive
1 mb Memory
Compaq Color Monitor 

with Color Card 
Epson FX-286e Printer 

Multi-User System:
Compaq 386 20 mhz 
with 2 mb Memory 
including all options for 

Singe-User System
2 IBM 3151 Terminals
1 Computone 4 Port Serial 

Board
2 Epson FX 286e Printers 
Multi-user System must

be able to run Xenix 
Operating System.

Any other computer with 
the same specifications will 
also be considered.

The bid must include 
set-up and installation of 
computer system.

Please send bids to the 
following address: Stratford 
Hospital District, P.O. Box 
1189, Stratford, Tx. 79084 
(806-395-5568).

Stratford Hospital District 
reserves the right to accept 
or reject any or all bids.

Scott Buckles, President 
Stratford Hospital District 

Board of Directors
Published in The Stratford 
Star, Thursday, March 31, 
1988 and Thursday, April 7, 
1988.

Chamber Banquet 
Cent. From Page 1 '
early preparing to start 
another day in the business 
he was not born into, but has 
found a love for.

He was born in Miami, 
Texas, his parents later 
moved to Amarillo. While 
going to high school this 
¿farmer worked at many jobs, 
including paper routes, 
bicycle mechanic, and gro­
cery stockboy.

In 1960 he married a girl 
from Friona and joined the 
navy for four years. While 
serving in the Navy, he was 
on the U.S.S. Kearsarge and 
was part of the rescue 
operation of the first 
American space traveller, 
Alan Shepherd on May 5, 
1961.

After his tour of duty was
over Jimmy returned to a job 
farming with his father-in- 
law J. L. Stowers in Sherman 
County. While faming was 
new to him, he quickly 
caught on to any and all 
tasks. Those first few years 
in farming were a learning 
experience, not only raising 
crops, but raising a family. 
He and Ineta have two 
daughters, Jacque and Carol 
and a son, Bobby. Both 
daughters have graduated 
from college and their son is 
a senior this year in Stratford 
High School.

This man now farms about 
1920 acres of land in 
Sherman County. When the 
land was purchased, there 
were no irrigation wells. 
Over the next few years, 
nine wells were drilled. 
Underground tile has been 
installed to carry water. 
Other improvements that he 
implemented have been land 
leveling for row-watering, 
tail water recovery systems, 
and sprinkler systems.

Jimmy has grown corn, 
grain sorghum, wheat and 
barley. He has tried 
sunflowers, soybeans and 
pinto beans in the past. 
Participation in recent farm 
programs has allowed for 
good rotation practices and 
he has used them to let the 
soil rest and rebuild.

With his wife, Ineta, and 
their children, Jacque, Carol 
and Bobby they know exactly 
what soil conservation 
means, not only in the soil 
and water programs, but 
also to prevent waste. Jimmy 
works to find ways to do so.

Ken Metzger, last years 
Citizen of Year, formerly of 
Stratford now of Brownfield, 
Texas came to present Linda 
Spurlock with this years 
award. Linda did not get to 
attend the banquet Friday 
night as she was in the

BID NOTICE

Sherman County will 
receive bids for Public 
Officials and Employees 
Liability Coverage with at 
least a $1,000,000.00 mini­
mum coverage and with a 
$5,000.00 deductible.

Bids will be opened on 
April 11, 1988 at 10:00 a.m. 
Bids to be submitted to the 
County Judge. Sherman 
County reserves the right to 
reject any and all bids.

W.S. Frizzell, Jr.
County Judge

Published in Stratford Star 
March 31 and April 7, 1988.

TOWN TALK

Zora Sanders had a few 
visitors last week; Mr. and 
Mrs. Murry Wheeler of Long 
Beach, Ca., Hassie Beaton of 
Bellflower, Ca. and Maxine 
Allen of Alaska. They all 
started back home Friday 
morning.

Using bright yellow paint mark 
regular parking stalls in the garage 
for children's bicycles and wagons.

hospital in Amarillo recovery 
from surgery. Accepting the 
award for Linda was her 
husband James, Her mother 
Mary Riffe and James 
Parents, Travis and Rene 
Spurlock.

Linda goes around quietly 
serving Stratford to fill the 
needs of the community 
either in business or service 
with her time, talent, 
thought or money. Always 
trying to make it a better 
place for each of the citizens. 
She is a soft spoken peace 
maker, always calm, cool 
even under stress. Always 
present in time of need 
without being asked, but 
there just in case theres a 
need to be filled.

•- ‘ • > i  KVi
Linda is a native of 

Stratford and her parents are 
Sherman County natives. 
When her and James 
married an aunt said they 
would be related to every­
one.

Linda has been a cub scout 
leader, Sunday School teach­
er, supporting parent of all 
her childrens school activi­
ties, whether sports, band, 
parties or proms. Beta Sigma 
Phi Soriety honored her with 
Woman of the Year.

Linda holds a degree in 
home economics and she 
shares her talents from the 
kitchen when theres a need, 
just because she enjoys 
doing it.

Linda Spurlock is a gentle, 
loving, caring “ Angel of 
mercy” .

Linda is also serving on 
Board of Stratford Area 
Foundation, Cemetery As­
sociation Advisory Board, 
Chairman of Work Area 
family ministry of the First 
United Methodist Church.

One of Linda’s special 
achievements has been her 
work in the Emergency 
Medical Services. In 1978 
she became and EMT and in 
1980 and ’81 took extensive 
hours of training to be a 
paramedic. She has done 
countless hours as a member 
of Stratford Ambulance 
service both as an attendant 
and a instructor either locally 
or the entire panhandle area. 
Her concern for people goes 
beyond attending in the 
ambulance. Its after they are 
in the hospital doors, seeing 
that the families are tended 
to and their needs are met 
also. She has even taken 
accidents victims into her 
home on occasion.

This “ Angel of Mercy”  is 
the daughter of Mary Riffe 
and the late Earl Riffe. She is 
married to James Spurlock 

?pnd they have 2 children, 
Brent who is a student at 
West Texas State and Mary 
Beth a student at Texas 
Tech.

Linda’s goal is to make 
Stratford a better place for 
each person in the communi­
ty and makes a good model 
for what a good citizen ought 
to be. On receiving the 
award Linda said “ That 
Stratford has given me far 
more than I can ever give in 
return” .
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OBITUARIES
Gall Edwin Wright

Stratford - Gail Edwin 
Wright, 65, died Thursday, 
March 24, 1988, in Dumas,
Tx.

Services were held Mon­
day, March 28 at 11 a.m. 
with Minister Clark Tatum 
officiating.

Mr. Wright, born in Lone 
Wolf, Okla., moved to 
Stratford in 1955 from 
Swisher County. He was a 
retired mechanic and had 
been employed by King 
Equipment Co. and Moore 
Implement Co. He was a 
Navy veteran of World War 
II and a member of the 
Church of Christ. He was 
married to Dorothy Jean 
Blount in 1942 at Plainview.

Survivors include his wife; 
two daughters, Carolyn 
Nelson of Dallas and Barbara 
Ann Russell of Germany; a 
sister, Joyce Ewing of 
Tacoma, Wash.; and a 
brother, Donnie Wright of 
Asher, Okla.

Funeral services were 
conducted by Morrison 
Funeral Directors of Strat­
ford.

Bedford Jr. Berry

Bedford Jr. Berry died, 
unexpectedly, March 22, 
1988 in Liberal, Kansas.

Bedford Jr. Berry was 
born to Bedford and Hattie 
Berry, July 31, 1924 in 
Clovis, New Mex.

He had made his home in 
Liberal for more than 40 

i years, moving'there from 
Texhoma where he grew up. 
He was employed by the 
R.C. Williams Trucking Co., 
working in the office.

He and his wife, Helen, 
would have celebrated their 
40th anniversary in June of 
this year.

He is survived by his wife, 
Helen, of the home; his 
mother, Hattie Berry, a 
resident of Dunaway Manor, 
Guymon; one sister, Virginia 
Hickman of Texhoma; one 
niece and one grandniece, 
Janet and Kaeli Caldwell of 
Amarillo, Tex.

Concluding services were 
conducted March 25 at the 
First Southern Baptist Chur­
ch of Liberal, with Rev. Dan 
Shaeffer, officiating.

Interment was In Restlawn 
Memorial Gardens of Liberal 
under direction of Kitch 
Funeral Home.

Mabel Stock

Texhoma-Mabel Stock, 85 
died Sunday, March 27, 
1988.

Services were held at 11 
a.m. Wednesday, March 30 
in Uhited Methodist Church 
w iti\ the Rev. Jan Putnam, 
pastor, officiating. Burial 
was at 11 a.m. Thursday, 
March 31 in Big Sandy 
Cemetery at Toronto, Kan­
sas by Dawson-Welch Fune­
ral Home of Texhoma.

Mrs. Stock was born in 
Toronto, Kan. She was 
married to Louie Stock in 
1923 at Eureka, Kan. He 
died in 1956. They moved to 
Texhoma in 1944 from 
Syracuse, Kan.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Joy Maddox of 
Texhoma and Dorothy Grif- 
frey of Carthage, Mo.; four 
sons, Paul Stock of Cushing, 
Texas, L.V. Eugene Stock of 
Canadian, Texas, Dale Stock 
of Salt Lake City and William 
Stock of Birmingham, Ala.; a 
sister, Lyla Luk of Syracuse, 
Kan.; 19 grandchildren; and 
13 great grandchildren.

The family requested 
memorials be to security 
system at Morton County 
Hospital at Elkhart, Kan.

Guy Gore

Boise City-Guy Gore, 71 
died Thursday, March 24 in 
Amarillo.

Services were held at 1:30 
p.m. Monday, March 28, 
1988 in Christian Church 
with the Rev. Tom Milburn, 
pastor, officiating. Burial 
was in Boise City Cemtery by 
Cimarron Mortuary.

Mr. Gore was born in 
Frederick, Okla. He was 
married to Dorotha Jo 
Thomason in 1937 at 
Texhoma, Okla. He was 
involved in farming and was 
a custom harvester.

Survivors include his wife; 
a daughter, Alice Gann of 
Guymon, Okla.; nine bro­
thers, Mike Gore of Dalhart, 
Texas, Ray Gore and Jack 
Gore, both of Stratford, 
Texas, Howard Gore of 
Sun ray, Tex. Leroy Gore of 
Deer Park, Tex., Bill Gore of 
Boise City, Okla. Jerry Gore 
and Bobby Gore, Both of 
Texhoma and Perry Gore of 
Guymon; six sisters, Pauline 
Hobgood of Dumas, Jewell 
Renner of Spearman, Lucille 
Bishop of Twin Falls, Idaho, 
Mary Lou Farmer of Guymon 
and Olla Mae Rhotden and 
Alimena Huddelston, both of 
Texhoma; two grandchild­
ren; and two great-grand­
children.

Fred [Lucky] Senna

Dallas, Texas Senna, Fred 
(Lucky) died March 18^1-988;" 
He is survived by his wife 
Viola (Babe) Senna, one 
daughter Maxine Tibbetts 
and four grandchildren 
Patrick, Michael, Kathleen, 
and Erin Tibbetts also three 
sisters.

Services were held at 2 
p.m. Monday, March 21st at 
Laurel Land Memorial Chap­
el in Dallas. Rev. Willis 
Lambert officiated and 
interment at Laurel Land 
Memorial Park, Laurel Land.

9 Candidates 
Cont. From Page 1
lock, Barbara Chumley, Billy 
Bell, Mike Vincent, Jess 
Willard, and incumbent 
Jerry Dyess. Three Trustees 
will be elected.

The terms of Marihoward 
Engelbrecht, Hoy Harrison, 
and Jerry Dyess are those 
that expire. Holdover 
members to the board are 
Doug McBryde, Margaret 
Reed, Jerry Johnson, and 
Steve Dettle.

Volleyball
Tournament
Stratford’s first annual 

Chamber of Commerce 
Volleyball tournament is set 
for April 18 thru the 23rd. 
Entry fees are $35.00 per 
team and the entry deadline 
is April 8. So hurry and sign 
up your team for this 
tournament. For more 
information call Donavan 
Ferguson at 396-2012 or 
Gay land Vandiver at 3962528 
or the Chamber office 
396-2260. You can pick up 
team roster forms at tne 
Chamber office. So hurry 
come sign up today.

Thursday, March 31_____

Guymon Varsity 
Girls Track Meet

8:00 p.m. AA-AI-Anon 

Friday, April 1__________

Good Friday Holiday 
Boys Ranch 
Track Meet 

Varsity, JV, 7th, 8th Boys
2p.m. Extension

Homemakers Council
1-4:30 p.m. SCOT

Quilting 
Good Friday 

[5th 6th weeks end

Sunday, April 3_________
EASTER

SUNDAY

Monday, April 4
12 Noon Lions Club
1-4:30 p.m. SCOT

Quilting
7:30 p.m. SCOT

Dance Practice 
7:30 p.m. EMT Assoc.

Tuesday, April 5________
8:00 a.m. TOPS 897
1:00 p.m. Star

Extension Homemaker 
3:00 p.m. SCOT

Games
7:00 p.m. Boy Scout

Troop Meeting 
7:30 p.m. Eastern Star

Wednesday, April 6

3:30 p.m. Sherman County 
Child Welfare Board 

1-4:30 p.m. SCOT
Quilting

Employee O f The Month

Employee of the Month for April, Dorene Harrison is 
presented with the traveling plaque by March Employee of 
the Month, Benita Huereca.

The Employee of the 
Month goes to Dorene 
Harrison employed by Smith 
Agency., She has., been 
em|
m m #

1973 for First State Insur­
ance and when that agency 
was purchased by Smith 
Agency in 1987, Dorene 
moved across the street.

This year has been a

le n u y * * o n e  n ,as . , D e e n  
iployed there for one year.. 
bhéhe'îétârtëd ’ WBtkinÿ W

period of adjustment for 
Dorene, as her youngest 
daughter, Stefanie, age 19, 
graduated from high.achooJ.. 
and is attending West Texas. 
State University and daugh­
ter, Kim and her husband 
Mike Halsten, presented 
Doreen and husband Henry 
with their “ firs t”  grandba-

Cont. On Page 8

P.0. BOX 39«
VILLA MERCADO SHOPPING CENTER 

TEL M6/93S-6M4
0UMAS. TEXAS 79029

* Dear Friends,

We have purchased, The Dumas Travel Center,and we 
[ plan to serve you to the best o f our ability. We invite you to 

call or drop in and visit with Toni Vincent and Lisa Casados\ 
They will be pleased to serve you with all your travel needs.

The use o f, The Travel Center, is not an extra expense. ! 

It is a customer service.

Stratford customers may call us, Jack and Wendolyn 
Vincent, 806-396-5388.

Toni and Lisa can make your air or bus reservations, 
print your tickets > make hotel, rental car reservations, get \ 
you boarding passes and seat assignments, for  all air lines.

Also if you have diet problems, special meals are 
arranged in advance. If you need a wheel chair, that will 
also be provided.

Let us serve you !

Á
icJz ,  -)L_

Women ’s Health Center
Norm al and  h igh risk p regnancies  

Gynecologic cancerscreen ing  
Breast cancer screen ing  

Infertility and  fa m ily  p lann ing  
M enopause and  ho rm one  p rob lem s

Dr. Turhan I. Boykaii M  D
Specializing In

OBSTETRICS-GYNECOLOGY
2 0 1 South Bliss M onday-Friday 9  a .m .-6 p .m .

A ppoin tm ents 935-6599  
Em erge iic ies 935-7171



THE STRATFORD STAR*THURSDAY,MARCH 31,1988 3

SCOT Notes
by T im m ie Brown

Top of the morning 
Sherman County Older 
Texans, Friends and Neigh­
bors! This past week has 
been a fast-paced week for 
all Stratford citizens, includ­
ing the “ Senior Citizens” .

First there are some dates 
to mark on our calendars 
though. Plans are In the 
making for two “ outings”  
for Scotters: April 9 -
Saturday - a dinner at K-Bob 
in Dalhart is scheduled and 
on Friday, April 15 the bus 
will make the trip to Guymon 
where riders will dine on 
Chinese food. Be sure to 
make reservations on the bus 
for these occasions. Call 
Ethel Hampton for reserva­
tions.

On April 8 (Friday) is the 
Birthday Party at Scot Hall. 
All S.C.O.T. folks who have 
an April Birthday are 
expected to be at Scot Hall at 
7 p.m. so that other 
members can wish them a 
happy day and all can enjoy 
games. We have not been 
given a current birthday list 
of names so we cannot issue 
an invitation via Scot Notes. 
Ethel, we would appreciate a 
list of names so we could 
remind busy folks to come to 
the party. Thank you! To 
Scotters, please note the 
dates of April 8, 9, and 15 for 
the good of the order and 
SCOT fellowship.

Reports from Scot Dance 
Sat. March 26, 1988 are 
encouraging. A goodly 
number of Scotters plus nine 
guests from Guymon had a 
good time dancing to 
records. Ethel Hampton 
very ably served as record 
“ operator”  in the absence of 
Jimmy Jackson and his 
promised records. Monday 
evening, Mar. 28 at dance 
practice tentative plans for a 
bus load of Scotters to attend 
Amarillo Sr. Citizen dance 
Friday April 1st will be 
finalized. Call Ethel for 
information- and. -reserva-** 
tions. . ai bfsii

Now to reealt^ana* “tblP 
about past events. Tues. 
Mar. 22, Corda Pleyer, Eskie

Ritchie, Audrey Gamble, 
Freida Dortch played 42. 
Bertha Oquin visited and 
Clarence Willmon came by. 
We had 2 or 3 other Scotters 
on Tues to play 42. Our 
“ Easter Parade of Hats”  

and Feast were great; The 
tabjes were very tastefully 
decorated carrying out the 
Easter Theme and the food 
was “ larapin” . The hosts 
were Dicy and Max 
Stevenson chairpersons. Bill 
& Boots Watson (Methodist 
pastor and wife), Howard 
and Chris Ethridge, Georgia 
Cook, Dolores Bunch, Ruby 
McNeal and W.P. Parvin 
and we were well taken care 
of - thank you.

The attendance was excel- 
lant between 85-95, includ­
ing a number of friends from 
ColdWater Manor. Our 
faithful blood-pressure clinic 
was in operation directed by 
Jack Gore. Thank You!

Vice-president Bill Riffe 
presided and quickly dispat­
ched business and routine 
recognitions of birthday, 
anniversaries and hospital 
report. Olene Caraway, 
program chairperson, intro­
duced our promised Special 
Surprise which proved to be 
3rd and 4th grade “ Story 
Tellers”  from the Mary 
Allen School. Principal Steve 
Haynes presented Coach 
Kathy Switser and Story 
Tellers Jessica Sikora, Cara 
Lavake, Finnan McClellan 
and Chris Haynes. They 
were adorable and the 
stories were told. Our 
schools are the pride and joy 
of all Scotters. Thank you 
adults for sharing these with 
us. Following the story 
tellers, Olene presented the 
Easter Hat Parade. It could 
have been no more fun 
unless more folks had worn 
hats! Marcella Sutton 
furnished the music, Easter 
Parade and Ain’t She Sweet 
and other tunes. Judges 
wqfe' Kathy Allen, Martha 
Mitts, Bill .Riffe plus Marty 
Robertson on hand with the 
Star camera. Winners were:

Best Easter Theme - Ethel 
Hampton 1st, Betty Brown 
2nd, Prettiest, Madeline 
Reesing 1st, Timmie Brown, 
2nd, Funniest,Roscoe Dyess 
1st, Doris Dyess,2nd. Thank 
you, Olene, for your 
faithfulness and the prizes.

Ruth Brown and her 
sister, Margaret Hughes of 
Guymon visited Brown 
relative in Stratford on Tues. 
March 22nd. Ethel Ally and 
Edith Stanfors of Niles, Ks. 
were visitors in Corda 
Pleyer’s home Friday and 
Saturday. Bertha Oquin and 
Timmie Brown joined the 
group on Saturday for a 
social time, then visited 
Sherman County Depot 
Museum and enjoyed the 
evening meal ‘out’ thanks to 
Bertha. Fern Gupton 
reported that she visited 
with Velma King Wyatt in 
the drs. office. Their 
feet were troublesome!

Carrie and Blair Brown, 
Lubbock, were present at the 
Cof C Banquet to add the 
grandparents Betty and 
Baskin Brown’s pleasure and 
surprises of the evening. 
“ Johnnie”  Lee, Spearman, 
Betty’s cousin attended the 
affair as did Patty, Jim Bob, 
Ashley and Caleb, Lorelyn 
Powers and, of course, 
Mother Timmie Brown. We 
appreciate Baskin’s thought­
fulness and presence of mind 
in all the excitement to state 
that it was due to the 
influence of Stratford Cham­
ber of Commerce forty years 
ago that he was able to 
establish Browns Food 
Locker.

We were so glad to 
welcome Bruce Dettle„ 
Amarillo, at the Easter 
Parade.

Alfa and Herb Folsom are 
still away - visiting their 
daughter Caroline in Fla. 
Caroline is a real estate 
dealer there.

Winnie Everett’s friends 
gave her a wonderful 
Birthday party Sunday, Mar. 
27. Seemed that half of 
Stratford and community 
were on hand to wish this 
truly precious old timer 
God-speed for years to come., 
Winnie’s late husband, Bob, 
Everett, was Scots first

Cont. On Page 4

R E V I V A L

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
APRIL 3 ■ 7

TRAVIS LaDUKE
EVANGELIST

DAN STREET
MUSIC DIRECTOR

NOON SERVICES 12:00-1:00
Come for Lunch & Bible Study

EVENING SERVICES 7:30
NURSERY FOR ALL AGES

EVERYONE INVITED!

b y  M a r y lo u  M c D a n ie l

With Channel 7, KVII 
crew members present, 
about 60 attended the March 
Kerrick Community covered 
dish supper which honored 
Lynn Wells. Ralph Hampton 
returned thanks. Following 
the supper, Pat Boren 
presented the fourth “ Ker­
rick Good Guy”  plaque to 
Lynn on behalf of the 
community. With the group 
singing “ Happy Birthday” , 
Lynn was given a “ Virgie 
Mathews Angel Food Cake”  
by Marylou McDaniel.

The Amarillo KVII crew 
were Yvette Perez, Mac 
Douglas, Jackie Smith. With 
them was Vicki Brooks of 
Volunteer Action Center of 
United Way. They had been 
filming Lynn throughout the 
day.

Following the supper and 
presentations, Brad James 
provided guitar music, then 
those who stayed later 
enjoyed some banjo playing.

Coming from Stratford 
were Nadine and Warren 
Miller, Joyce Harper, Gene­
vieve Wilson, Mary & R.J. 
Hill, Derrek Wells, Amie 
Vincent, Susie, Wes and 
Walter Spurlock, Don and 
Gaynell Riffe, LeRayne 
Donelson.

Boise City visitors were 
R,P. and Carrie Crabtree, 
Judy and Lyman Potter, 
Blanche James, Shane 
Pruitt.

From Kerrick were Hank 
and Mabel Rogers, Kayo and 
Jo June McDaniel, Doug, 
Anita and Mandy Taylor, 
Nita Taylor, Terry and 
Barbara Schoonover, Bill 
and Pat Boren, Franny 
Taylor, Joyce Irlbeck, Ralph, 
Minnie, Ralph James and 
Annette Hampton, Bevin, 
Donna and April Avent, 
Brady Schoonover, Gayla, 
Trew, Levi and Thea James, 
Fred and Marylou McDaniel, 
Kenneth and Lynn Wells, 
Kim and Matt Thompson.- , 
- Hosts were Vicki $nd Gary 

Thompson, Dayle and Alvin 
Harris. They had decorated

tables with streamers of light 
and dark green and Easter 
baskets with dyed eggs, 
chicks and rabbits.

Going to hear Baxter Black 
at Dalhart Chamber of 
Commerce March 25 were 
Terry Schoonover, Bill Bor­
en, Shane Pruitt, Mike 
McDaniel and Fred McDani­
el.

The Richard James family 
was in Canyon Sunday where 
Richard and Donal were 
joined by Sue’s father, Floyd 
Kiser, for the WT Rodeo. 
Sue and her mother, 
Drennan, visited Buffalo 
Lake Refuge. They had a 
brief visit with Paula Ivey 
who is Rodeo treasurer.

Marjorie and Dick Mun- 
den, Claude, came Sunday 
for Brett and Talle Cumm­
ings wedding showqr. Virgie 
Mathews went w itff them to

the shower.
Attending the Stock Show 

Buyer’s Appreciation Ban­
quet March 24 in Stratford 
were the families of Ben Tom 
James, Gary Thompson and 
Alvin Harris.

Mabel Rogers had Yag 
Laser eye surgery Friday 
afternoon in Amarillo, then 
came home. Isn’t the 
“ miracle of modern surgery’̂ , 
wonderful?

There will be a Bon 
Voyage Party Thursday 
night, March 31, 7:30 p.m. 
at the Community Center for 
Ted and Joyce Irlbeck. The 
Irlbecks are going to Italy to 
visit son Randy who works in 
Rome. Bring ice cream 
and/or cake for the first of 
the season! Lynn Wells is 
hostess.

The original title  of Gone With The 
Wind was Tomorrow Is Another Day.

Hear Lessons that Will Inspire

« t i« * '« /

Ron.
y o u / Oh

SUNDAY

MONDAY

TUESDAY

T H £  J o y  o f

CHRISTIANITY

A P K 1 L  JO - 15

Host Church:

STRATFORD CHURCH OF CHRIST
3rd & Chestnut Stratford, Texas

a Bible-believing, non-denom inational church

S chedu le  of Services:

1 1 : 00  A . M . -  V i r g i l  Yocham,  Lubbock,  Texas
" J o y  Comes From Be i ng  T h a n k f u l " - ? * i l i p p t a n t  1 : 1 - 1 *  

6 : 0 0  P . M . -  " J o y  I s  Be i n g  C h r i s t  M i n d e d " - P h i l i p p i a n s  2 : 1 -

7 : 3 0  P. M. -  G a y l o r d  C o o k , D a l h a r t ,  Texas  ..................
" J o y  I s  L i v i n g  In God ' s  U i l l " - P h i l i p p i a n s  2 . 1 2 - 1 B

7 : 3 0  P.M. F . I .  S t a n l e y ,  Sunray ,  Texas  ,
" J o y  Comes From C h r i s t  Còh f i dené ' è  " i p h i l . 3 : 1 - 2 1

WEDNESDAY 7 : 3 0  P . M . -  Kenny  B a y l e s ,  Dumas, Texas  , ,
" J o y  Comes From C o d ’ s P r o m i s e s P h i l . I . i s - s s

I
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I
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L E T " !

The Churches of Stratford Welcome Your Family
FIRST UNITED METHODIST

Rev. Bill Watson 
520 N. Main

Sunday School 9:40 am 
Morning Worship 10:50 am 
Junior High UMY 5:30 pm 
Senior High UMY 6:00 pm 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm

ASSEMBLY OF GOD
Rev. Lor>ny Robbins 

Corner of Purnell & Fulton 
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:45 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm

FIRST CHRISTIAN
Rev. David Harker 
5th & N. Main St. 

Sunday Coffee Fellowship 
9:00 am
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:45 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday,Adult Choir 
8:00 pm

CALVARY BAPTIST
David Jones 

302 S. Main St.
Sunday School 10:00 am 
Morning Worship 11:00 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Prayer Service 
& Bible Study 7:00 pm

ST. JOSEPH CATHOLIC
Monsignor Kevin Hand 

515 S. Pearl St.
Sunday Mass 8:30 am 
Saturday Evening Mass 
6:30 pm
Mass in Sunray 11:00 am

FIRST BAPTIST
Dr. Derrel Lewis 

702 North 3rd 
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:50 am 
Church Training 6:00 pm 
Evening Worship 7:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm THE GOAL OF

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Minister Clark Tatum 
N. 3rd & Chestnut St. 

Sunday School 10:00 am 
Morning Worship 11:00 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm 

GOALS
Zaccheus was a man little in stature. He had a desire to 

see Jesus but the crowd obstructed his view. So what did he 
do? He ran before and climbed up into a tree, and from that 
viewpoint he was able to see Jesus. Zaccheus was determined 
to see Jesus.

How many times do we have a goal or plan blocked by 
circumstances or immediate needs that come up? Do we at 
this point get caught up in immediate hindrances and change 
our direction or lose sight of our original desire? Zaccheus 
could have said, “ It looks like I ’m not going to get to see 
Jesus so I guess I ’ll just sit over here on the side and watch 
the people instead.”  or perhaps, “ I might as well give up and 
go home because there is no way for me to see Jesus.” If 
there is a goal worth having there is a goal worth keeping. 
Don’t give up on your goals and go home.

As our specific goals and plans become entangled with 
obstructions, we should look to Zaccheus’ example. We 
should look for a way to see over the immediate hindrance and 
just climb higher if necessary to fulfill our desire. Remember 
when Zaccheus determined to see Jesus, he not only saw 
Him, but Jesus saw Zaccheus and went home with him. When 
Zaccheus resolved to see Jesus he got even a closer view than 
he imagined possible.

When dealing with our obstructions that come between us 
and our goals, we should look for a way up and not a way out. 
If we do this, according to the Lord’s will and with the Lord’s 
help, no desire is unattainable.

No matter how many goals in life you have there is one goal 
that puts all the others in perspective. That goal must be “ I 
desire to see Jesus” , and no obstacle can keep me from Him. 
Paul the Apostle wrote, “ Who shall separate us from the love 
of Christ? Shall trouble or hardship or persecution or famine 
or nakedness or danger or sword?”  He goes on to say in 
Romans Chapter Eight, “ ...nothing will be able to separate 
us from the love of Christ” . Paul is the one who wrote; “ I can 
do all things through Christ who give me strength” . In 
Phillippians Chapter Three Paul shows his determination to 
see Jesus.

Clark Tatum 
Church of Christ

DUNCAN CHEVROLET 
& OIL COMPANY

396-5557 396-2835

WILLIAMS REPAIR SERVICE
396-5330 396-2322

NORTH PLAINS SAVINGS 
& LOAN 

396-5534
CIMARRON FEEDERS,INC. 

1-405-543-6383 Griggs

HEADQUARTERS RESTAURANT

396-2120

STRATFORD GRAIN CO. 
396-5541 Lautz 769-4485

OLSON AUTOMOTIVE
396-5572

WALTER LASLEY A SONS, INC. 
753-4411

ALBERTS GROCERY A MARKET 
396-2330

C A C TEXACO STATION 
CACTEXACO PRODUCTS 

396-2547 396-2131

CONSUMERS CO. 
396-2261

THE GIRLS NEXT DOOR 
C'S MALE-BOX 

396-5971

TECO
396-2300

STRATFORD STAR 
396-5885
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Paintings in the Brown 
Store window were done by 
7th grade students of Cindy * 
Russell. This and other 
student work will be showing 
through April and May. 
Watch the window to see 
what our young artists are 
doing.

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Don 
McLaughlin are proud to 
announce the birth of their 
son Michael Don. Born 
March 16th at 10:20 p.m., he 
weighed 7 pounds 9.8 ounces 
and 20 inches long at Dumas 
Memorial Hospital.

Maternal Grandmother is 
Deanna Mixon. Paternal 
Grandparents are Don and 
Sue McLaughlin.

Art News Births

A Post-Nuptial Shower for Mrs. Brett [Talle] Cummings was 
held Sunday afternoon March 27th in the home of Mrs. Gary 
Hudson. Standing above left to right Is Mrs. Nola Cummings 
of Amarillo, Mrs. Rose Williams of Boise City, Grandmothers 
of Brett, Talle, Mrs. Ruby Garoutte, Brett’s Great 
Grandmother and Darla Cummings, Brett’s mother. 
Hostesses were Mesdames: Leslie Dodson, Gary Garoutte, 
Leroy Judd, Elwyn Bass, Jimmy Chesher, Gary Hudson, 
James Spurlock, Hal Bennett, Ben Ingham, Gary Lundburg. 
Al Baker and Shirley Plunk.

Menu
April 4-8

Monday- Spaghetti /Sauce, 
tossed Green salad, green 
beans, rolls, peach cobbler. 
Tuesday-Corn Dogs, French 
Fries, Pork Beans, Fruit 
cups, cowboy Bread. 
Wednesday-Burritos/Chiii, 
spinach, cole slaw, fruit 
(pears)
Thursday-Taco Pizza, lettuce 
and tomatoes, mixed veg. 
pineapple upside down cake. 
Friday-Hamburger/ Cheese, 
lelttuce, pickle relish, onions 
french fries, fruit, cinnamon 
rolls.

Kim and Mike Haisten 
announce the birth of a baby 
daughter, Sheibi Rheanne, 
born at 5:49 a.m., February 
28, 1988 at Northwest Texas 
Hospital in Amarillo, Tx. 
She weighed 9 lbs. 2 Vi 
ounces and was 20 Vi inches 
long.

Gandparents are L.R. and 
Louise Haisten and Henry 
and Dorene Harrison. Great 
Grandparents are Oneta 
Haisten, Amarillo, Earl and 
Darlene Thompson, Dalhart, 
Jessie and Lena Mae Davis, 
Conlen and A.J. and Juanita 
Rollins of Ingram, Texas.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald K. Rlffe of Stratford announce the 
engagement of their daughter Carrie Gay to James Bradbury 
Smith, the son of Dr. and Mrs. Robert L. Smith of LaJunta, 
Colorado. Carrie Is the grandaughter of Doris Parker and 
Mary Rlffe of Stratford. The wedding will take place June 3 in 
the First United Methodist Church In Stratford, Rev. Ken 
Metzger officiating. Carrie is a graduate of Stratford High 
School and Texas Tech University with a BS in Home 
Economic Education and Elementary Education. She is a 
member of Zeta Tau Alpha social sorority. She is currently 
employed by Plains, Texas ISD. Jim is a graduate LaJunta 
High School, Colorado and University of Notre Dame with a 
degree In Mechanical Engineering. He served 4 years with 
the United States Army as an engineering officer. He will be 
graduating from the Texas Tech University School of 
Medicine in May and will begin residency training at William 
Beaumont Army Hospital in El Paso.

iS  Out The Library
By Dorothy Halle

Feather on the Moon, 
written by Phyllis A. 
Whitney, is a thrilling, 
suspense-filled drama. Born 
of American parents In 
Yokohama, Japan, Phillis A. 
Whitney is known interna­
tionally as one of America’s 
foremost writers of romantic 
suspense. The author 
weaves a mesmerizing tale 
against the colorful backdrop 
of resplendent English 
gardents, mystical Indian 
traditions, and the haunting 
mystery of the feather and 
the moon.

Judith Barnard and Mic­
hael Fain - the two halves of 
"Judith Michael - are 
husband and wife writing 

Scot Notes 
Cent. From Pago 3

president. We appeal to 
son, Joe, to get a guestlist of 
old timers to the Star or us 
next week.

The drama "Master Is It 
I?" presented at the 
Methodist Church Sunday 
evening was well received 
and appreciated. For three 
years a group of twelve men 
from the First Christian 
Church, Pam pa, have pre­
sented this play. Of special 
interest to Stratford ites is 
the fact that James, the 
Lesser is played by Ron 
Hughes. Vickie Jackson 
Hughes is Mrs. Ron Hughes. 
Vickie and Ron are children 
of Jimmy and Peggy Jackson 
and grand-children of Lucille 
Phillip. Hence "our young 
folks". Vicki teaches in 
Pampa and Ron is a P.O. 
employee. They are visiting 
here for a few days. 
Welcome and best wishes to 
Nola Cummings. We 
received your mesage. 
Thanks.

Scotter’s love and prayer 
support go to the Wright 
family in the loss by death of 
husband and father Gait and 
to Jack Gore in the death of 
his brother, Gig Gpre, Boise 
City. The Lord gives and He 
Takes away but He never 
forsakes. Blessed be the 
name of the Lord.

For this week, Scotters, 
lets be sweet and peasant 
scattering S.C.O.T. shoulder 
pats and luv V  round 
about!

partners. Inheritance, the 
newest novel, takes the 
reader from the cobbleston- 
ed streets of Boston’s 
Beacon Hill to the fashion­
able enclaves of the 
European jet set, from the 
loneliness of the outsider 
looking into the triumph of 
worldly success and the 
embrace of a loving family. 
Inheritance delivers a legacy 
of riches with heart and love 
and superb storytelling.

Inheritance and Feather 
on the Moon may be found in 
the Sherman County Public 
Library.

Library hours are: 
Monday 1:00 p.m. to 8:00 
p.m.- Tuesday through 
Thursday 1:00 p.m. to 5:00 
p.m. Friday the Library is 
closed. Saturday hours are 
9:00 p.m. to 1:00 p.m.

Bruct and Judy Dollar were honored with a reception Sunday 
afternoon, March 27th at the Stratford Country Club, Judy, 
Bruoe and Billy are shown above.

The Joy Of Christianity
there is and we ask you to 
accept our invitation to hear 
some tremendously encour­
aging thoughts from the 
inspired Book of Philippians. 
The dates for these lessons 

are April 10th-13th, at the
Cont. On Page 6

Dear Stratford Residents,
In a world where there 

seems to be little joy one 
might wonder, " I f  there can 
be any joy in following 
Christ?" Perhaps you’ve 
asked, "Is  there any joy in 
Christianity?" We believe

Catherine O. Taylor
Public Accountant

North Plains Building 
401 N. 3 rd 396-2435

M on d ay  - Friday 9 a. m. - 5 p. m.

Smith Agency
For Ail Your Insurance Needs

806-396-2031
396-2379

Sharon Brown Miles Smith

Congratulations to our student
C a m ie  F r a z ie r  

Winner - Dumas, Texas 
Kids o f America Pageant 

Sign-up now for Pageant Preparatory
806 -249 -8036

A c e  s r d w s :

0-2 Years 
3-4  Years

Kindergarten - 1st Grade 
2 n d -3 rd  Grade

U S t f K
B 6 6

W h Y

April 3rd 3:00 P.M.
STRATFORD CITY PAKK

Bad Weather - Come to  County Bam,
Sot Ifit Easter Bunny. Ha wants to  share 

his eggs w ith you.

RETAIL MERCHANTS DIVISION 
CHAMBER OF COMMERCE

The coming of this holy 
day once again reminds 
us how much our life 
is based on faith... 
faith in our nation, 
our leaders and 
our fellow man.
We wish you 
much happiness 
during this joyful time 
of the year. May the spirit of Easter lift your heart and 
remain with you during the weeks that lie ahead.

Q td ti 3 m k
STRATFORD.TEXAS

M IM H IK  F IU fR A I. O IK T J IT  IN S U IA N C I  COB POk A T I OH
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Cards of Thanks
THANK YOU TO ALL D.I.A.L. VOLUNTEERS

Mr. Haynes and I wish to thank all of our dedicated 
volunteers who helped make our preschool screen a 
success this year. You are the key to a good screen. 
Thank you for the time you spent in training, 
preparation, and those behind the scenes necessities to 
make a program run well. Thank you to Bonnie Brooks, 
Sandy Baskin, Amy Donelson, Nancy Kimball, Doris 
Parsons, Gail Presley, Lori Tatum, and Katie 
Whiteside. We appreciate the long hours you put in for 
the screening program. I’m glad you are all in 
Stratford I

Sincerely,
Chris McAdams, D.I.A.L.-R Coordinator 
Steve W. Haynes, Elementary Principal

TO PARENTS, GRANDPARENTS, AND FRIENDS OF 
PRESCHOOLERS: |
We wish to thank you for your interest and support of 
our district's preschool screening program. Your 
patience with us throughout a long day was greatly 
appreciated. We enjoyed seeing those of you we had 
met in the past years and it was great to meet so many 
new faces. We enjoyed serving you through this project 
and hope to see you again next yeaivYour children hold 
the key to the future and their success and progress is 
Important to us all.

Sincerely,
Memers of the 1988 D.I.A.L.-R Team 

Chris McAdams, Coordinator 
Steve W. Haynes, Elementary Principal

The SHS Cheerleaders would like to thank Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Brooks for taking the victory be|l to and 
from the football games. Also, we would like to thank 
the Stratford Fire Dept, for the escorts during the 
winning road in basketball. Last but not least we would 
like to thank the fans-that supported the Elks and 
Elkettes, during the season.

Thanks again-SHS cheerleaders

Thanks to everyone who sent cards or flowers called 
or came by to see me while I was in the Hospital and 
since I came Home.

B.F. Henry

We would like to take this opportunity to tell 
everyone how much we appreciate the support yoy have 
given us. The reception was wonderful. We are leaving 
a good community and good friends. We'll miss you.

Bruce, Judy and Billy Dollar

I would like to express my appreciation to the 
Sherman County Parents/Leaders Association for the 
buckle that was presented to me at the Sherman County

and support of the 4,-H program and me is great ant
>rt toam very appreciative of It. It takes total support to have 

a successful program and We are fortunate to have that 
kind of support. Again, may I say thank you from the 
bottom of my heart.

Jim Allison

NOTE OF APOLOGY

The Sherman County Show Board would like to 
apologize to Stratford Feedyard and Albert Zimmer for 
leaving you off the program at the Buyer’s Appreciation 
Banquet. We appreciate your support very much and 
feel badly that you were accidently left out. Again 
please accept our sincere apology.

Sherman County Livestock Show Board

We want to take this opportunity to say Thank You 
for a job well done to everyone who worked so hard to 
make our annual Chamber Banquet such a wonderful 
success. Showing once again how this community 
always pulls together in making each and every event 
sponsored by the Chamber a very special occasion for 
everyone. We appreciate the generous donations, 
delicious meal and all the time, tafent and effort given 
by everyone.

Stratford Chamber of Commerce

I would like to express my appreciation to those that 
nominated and or selected me for Farmer of the Year. It 
was a great honor and I thank you for it.

Jimmy Chesher

FARRIER SERVICE
★  HORSESHOEING if 

if CORRECTIVE SHOEING ★  

if SPECIAL RATES FOR 4-H ★

Coll Rusty Horn 769-4493

Evelyn Twin Theatre
Dumas, 1x935-4005

Starting Friday, April 1st
Screen 1 - Good Morning Vietnam  

With Robin Williams ( Rated R )

Screen 2 - Vice Versa
With Judge Remold ( Rated P G )

What’s Happening ! !
Another Track 
Record Broken 1988 Sherman County 

Spelling Bee

The Relay team broke a school record Saturday at the Boise 
City Track Meet. The 3200 relay was run in 8:59.52. The boys 
running were Gared McBryde, Chris Waters, Dirk Davis and 
Brad McBryde.

Globe News Spelling Bee Junior Spellers under the firectiorf 
of Debby Abbe are Ricky Garza, Chan Smith, Catalina Ortega 
School Champ, Uvette Rodriguez, Christ! Tobias and Patsy 
Cruz Alt. Not pictured.

The 1988 Sherman County 
Spelling Bee was hosted by 
Texhoma Middle School on 
March 23. Twenty-two 
students from Stratford and 
Texhoma competed for the 
honors of junior and senior 
championship. It was a 
clean-sweep for TMS with 
students winning both 
championship and runner-up 
positions.

Erik Jones, eighth grade 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Jones, repeated as the senior 
champion after winning that 
division last year and 
winning the junior divisions 
as a fifth and sixth grader. 
He will compete in the

regional contest in Canyon, 
Texas, on April 16. Tracy 
Winfrey, an eighth grader, 
was the runner-up.

In the junior divison, Gary 
Wallace, the sixth grade son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Erland 
Wallace, defeated Patton 
Ellis. Gary will be 
recognized at the regional 
contest but will not compete.

Texhoma students com­
peting were Sharon Coffey, 
Becky Ingham, Tammy 
Shores and Samantha Har­
ber in the senior division and 
Jayson Cole, Jason. Schrei­
ner, Jana Skelton, and Levi 
Berry in the junior division.

Senior Spellers under the direction of Luella Johnson are 
Vidal Trevino School Champ, Larry Sims, Sue Baeza and 
Matthew Sutterfield. The School Champion Bee was held 
March 21 and the Sherman County'BèeTYR TéShôma v m W  
March 23rd. —„

Sis! Boom! 
Bah!
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: Friday, Saturday, Sunday 7PM & 9:15PM  (2 Shows 

Monday thru Thursday 7:30 PM (1  Show)

FOR OF March 21, 1988
TEACHER STUDENT CC'MENTS
RINDA ALLISON Any Tillery Worked extra hard on fractions
DIANE WARD Katie Norris Sweet, kind, a good student It
LYNDA HAUSER Brandi Ross Works hard in math; Fun to be around; dresses neatlv
LINDA SWAIN Nick Phelps Courteous, dresses neatly, hard working, neat work
TERRI TEIG Brandi Brown A/erv nice manners
BARBARA HAILE Rick Ward Attitude and classwork is great
MIKE BROWNLEE Shasha Browning Hard working student with a great attitude
D&YNE PLUNK Michael Brooks Good attendance; work is in on time
SONJA KENDRICK Anna Amador Alwavs works quietlv
LARRY NORRIS Ramiro Rodriquez Quiet; easy going; pleasant
BETTY INGHAM Mary Lopez A good clarinet player; is very attentive

m Fifth Grade Spring Musi­
cal - Sis! Boom! Bah! April 
5, 1988, 7:00 p.m. Mary 
Allen Elementary Auditor- 

1-.„: ¡urn. Reception following 
f p  the performance.

Sis! Boom! Bah! is a two- 
act, fun-filled football musi­
cal which is really about 
school spirit, teamwork, 
never giving up and doing 
your best no matter what the 
field. You’ ll meet Knute 
Rockne, Coach Agnes 
Gooch, the cheerleaders, the 
fans, the players — as the 
whole school revs up for the 
Big Game with State.

Daylight 
Savings 
Time

Easter Sunday 
Remember

,1*

To Change 
Clocks

Available Space

Elk Pharmacy
396-5505

TECO
396-2300

North Plains The Allen Agency 
Savings & Loan 3 9 6 -o 8 l0

396-5534
i j

Olson Automotive Stratford Star
396-5572 396-5885

Cimarron Feeders, Inc. Albert’s Grocery & Market 
1-405-543-6383 Griggs 396-2330

Stratford Grain Co. Cold water Manor
Stratford 396-5541 Lautz 769-4485 396-5568

Thriftway
396-5586

The Girls Next Door
& C’s Male Box

396-5971

Consumers Company 
396-2261

Brooks Motor Company 
396-2470

Walter Lasley & Sons, Inc. 
753-4411

: JSX.KJ
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SCOT Easter Party
Hat Winners

Story O f Easter Brought To Life 
37th Annual Easter Pageant

Kenton, Oklahoma

i l s

■ i R B B
Easter Theme Winners were Betty Brown-second and Ethel 
Hampton received First.

The Prettiest hats belonged to Madeline Reesing, First and 
Timmie Brown, second.

The story of Easter will be 
brought to life once again at 
the 37th annual Easter 
Pageant near Kenton, Okla­
homa, Saturday and Sunday, 
April 2nd and 3rd.

The story, taken from the 
King James Version of the 
Bible, will be portrayed from 
the Last Supper to the 
Ascension.

The Saturday evening 
performance is timed to 
dramatize the moment of the 
Crucifixion, with Christ 
hanging from the cross 
between two thieves, just as 
the sun sets over the rugged 
canyon wall.

This performance of the 
death of Christ and the 
despair of the world, will be 
followed on Sunday morning 
by the living hope of the 
Resurrection, as the sun 
rises on a great earthquake 
and the wonderful scene of 
the Ascension.

The cast of the Kenton 
Easter Pageant is composed 
of ranchers, farmers, house­
wives, students, business 
and professional people from 
the surrounding areas, who 
devote their time and labor 
to the presentation of the 
pageant. Some of the cast

members are third and 
fourth generation partici­
pants. Their dedication is 
emphasized by the fact that 
they never release names of 
the cast to the public.

The pageant grounds are 
located in the beautiful Black 
Mesa Canyon country one 
and one-half miles east of 
Kenton, in the Oklahoma 
panhandle. The canyon 
walls serve as a natural 
theater, with the pageant 
taking place on the hillside 
as the audience watches 
from their cars in the valley 
below.

Services are scheduled for 
6:00 p.m. CST Saturday and 
7:00 a.m. CDST Sunday. 
Meals will be served at 
nearby Camp Billy Joe 
following each of the 
services.

Camper hookups are 
available at Kenton, Camp 
Billy Joe, and Lake Etling for 
people who may wish to stay 
in the area overnight. There 
are also five dorm accomo­
dations at Camp Billy Joe 
(405-261-7482). Anyone 
desiring more information 
may call Galen Smith at 
405-261-7431.

5 Days Set For Absentee Runoff 
Vote In Democratic Party

The Funniest Hats belonged to Dicy Stephenson, Raymond 
Dyess, Doris Dyess got second and Roscoe Dyess first. Four good looking story tellers from the Mary Allen School 

came to SCOT Hall Thursday, March 24th to tell a story, 
“ Same Story” , 4Different Versions” . It was very 
entertaining. Shown above is Steve Haynes-Principal, Chris 
Haynes, Cara Lavake, Jessica Sikora, Finnan McClellan and 
Coach Mrs. Kathv Switser.

Sherman County Resi­
dents will have a limited 
time, only five days to cast 
absentee votes in the April 
12 Primary Runoff Election 
of the Democratic Party.

Absentee voting is sched­
uled for April 4-8 at the 
Sherman County Clerk’s 
Office in Stratford.

There will be only one 
runoff contest listed on the 
Democratic Ballot. Demo-

The Oldest Hats were worn by Eskle Ritchie-second and 
Audrey Gamble-First.

T h e  m o s t  m o d e r n  s a t e l l i t e  c a t t l e  a u c t i o n  e v e r  p r o d u c e d  w i l l  be c o m i n g  t o  y o u  LIVE

ATTEND OUR NEXT SALE AT 108 W 3rd DALH ART
THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 10:00 A.M. CENTRAL TIME

on Communication Satellite TELESTAR 303 CHANNEL 17
The Satellite Cattle Exchange takes title to the cattle. 
This allows the seller to deal only with the Satellite Cattle 
Exchange through his Broker, and the buyer to deal 
directly with Satellite Cattle Exchange.

Satellite

To become a buyer, call Satellite Cattle Exchange today in 
order to participate in the regular sales held twice per month. 
Plan to attend the sale at Satellite Cattle Exchange in ¿a ; r, r  7 TX 
or at your nearest Broker location, or if you desire, at home with 
your television satellite receiver tuned to Telestar 303 Channel 17

To Consign Cattle Contact 
Certified Brokers:
Richard Gallo or Larry W ing  
108 W . 3rd 249-6531

Certified Agents:
Ike Carter-359-6904 
Don Prather-405-426-2416  
Lanny Cook-267-2192 
Bob Payne-249-5694 
Ben Woolley-384-2364

Cattle Exchange

1

: .r ?

crats will decide on a 
candidate for State Senator 
from the 31st District.
Facing each other in the 
runoff will be Mel Phillips 
and Bryan Poff, both .of 
Amarillo.

The April 12 winners will 
face opponents In the 
November General Election.

V.B. Morris, Sherman 
County Democratic Chair­
man, will have all seven 
precinct boxes open for 

lv$herman County Residents 
to voté 'on April 12 for th e : 
Primary Runoff, so you can 
vote at your regular voting 
box for the runoff.

i

. 'i
Joys of Christianity 
Cont. From Page 4

Church of Christ building.
These lessons will inspire us ) 
to live more closely to God’s j  
ways. Please notice our flyer 
for a schedule of services.
Any person needing trans­
portation may call 396-5546.
We would count it a great |  
privilege to have you come 
be with us. ■£

AUCTION
REAL ESTATE -  FARM LAND -  SEED CLEANING PLANT 

SEED PROCESSING EQUIPMENT -  SEED/FARM EQUIPMENT

2 Days - Friday, April 1 & Saturday, April 2, 1988
Sale Time: 10:00 a.m. Each Day

LOCATED: From Stratford, Texas, bVz miles Southwest on Highway 54 then 1 mile West on Dirt 
Road, OR From Dalhart, Texas, 25 l/2 miles Northeast on Highway 54 then 1 mile West on Dirt Road.

B. B. McDOUGAL, SHELLEY SEED, INC. (HOWARD SHELLEY) -  Owners
Telephones: (405) 224-3217 or (806) 396-2090 or (806) 727-4248

The following will be sold at Public Auction -  Any Announcement Sale Day Takes Precedence

1st Day: Friday, April 1, 1988 -  Sale Time: 10:00 a.m.
FARM EQUIPMENT

2nd Day: Saturday, April 2, 1988 -  Sale Time: 10:00 a.m.
REAL ESTATE -  FARM LAND -  SEED CLEANING PLANT -  SEED PROCESSING EQUIPMENT -  SEED
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TRACT I -  SEED PROCESSING PLANT and 32 ACRES LAND
Seed Processing Plant Will Ee Sold At 10:00 a.m. -  Owner has IS  minutes to accept or reject any ind /or all bids on Seed Cleaning Plant and Real Estate

D E S C R IP T IO N : 1 -4 0  X 8 0  X 1 6 ' S tee l B u ild in g ,  1 - 3 6 'X 1 2 0 'X 1 8 ' F ra m e  W a re h o u s e  B u ild in g ,  1 - 1 2 'X 5 6 ’ M o b ile  Home Used For Office & Scale 
B u ild in g , W ith  1 0 'X 7 0 '- 5 0  T o n  C a rd in a l T ru c k  S ca les (M o d e l 3 6 0 ) ,  4 4 'X 5 4 '- 4  S to ry  7 2 ' S e e d  P ro c e s s in g  P la n t, W ith  140'-5000 BPH Elevator 
L e g , S u p e r K -2 2 4 8  B D W  S eed C le a n e r , W ith  A m o s  B a ll K it ,  2 -P a n o g e n  6 0  S eed  T re a te rs ,  2 - 1 0 0 0  B u s h e l B a g g in g  Tanks, 2-4000 Bushel 
H o ld in g  T anks , 5 -1 0 0 0  B u sh e l H o ld in g  T a n k s , 3 -1 0 0 0  B u s h e l D u m p  P its , W ith  2 -1 0 X 1 2  R o ll U p  S te e l D o o rs , A Complete Seed Cleaning Plant. 
S IT E  IM P R O V E M E N T S . A p p ro x . 2 4 ,0 0 0  S q. F t. C o n c re te  P a v in g , A p p ro x . 1 0 ,0 0 0  S q. F t. R ock  F o r P a rk in g  A re a , W a te r  Well & Septic System. 
L E G A L  D E S C R IP T IO N : T h e  E a s t 3 2  A c re s  O u t  O f N / 2  O f S e c t io n  2 6 1 ,  B lo c k  1 -T , T & N O  RR  S u rv e y , S h e rm a n  County, Texas.
T E R M S : 1 0 %  E s c ro w  D ay O f S ale , R e m a in d e r  U p o n  C lo s in g  C L O S IN G : Soon A s  P o s s ib le  A l lo w in g  A d e q u a te  T im e  F o r  A ll Paper Work With 
D ilig e n c e . T A X E S : 1 9 8 8  T a xe s  A s s u m e d  B y  B u y e r  & P a s t Y e a r  T a xe s  B y  S e lle r .

TRACT II -  LAND AUCTION Sold Immediately After Seed Processing Plant -  6. B. McDougal, Owner

R E A L  E S T A T E : S e llin g  1 ,2 5 0  A c re s  S h e rm a n  C o u n ty  F a rm  L a n d .
L E G A L  D E S C R IP T IO N : S e c t io n  2 6 1  & 2 8 6  B lo c k  1 -T , T & N O  R R  S u rv e y , S h e rm a n  C o u n ty ,  T e xa s . F a rm  N o . A -1 3 0 .
A L L O T M E N T S : 1 ,2 7 0  A c re s  C u lt iv a te d ,  7 8 7 . 6  A c re s  C R P  P ro g ra m , 4 8 2 . 4  A c re s  B a la n c e . W h e a t B a se : 2 5 3 . 7  Base, Yield 40 Bushel 
( I r r ig a te d ) ,  2 1  B u s h e l (D ry la n d ) .  S o rg h u m : 1 0  4  B a se , Y ie ld  7 5  B u s h e l ( I r r ig a te d ) ,  4 2  B u s h e l ( D ry la n d ) .
IM P R O V E M E N T S : 6 -W e lls , W ith  8 "  P u m p s , A p p r o x  4 8 0 ' T o  5 0 0 ’ D e e p , A p p ro x . 3 5/« M ile s  O f 8 "  &  1 0 ’ ’ P la s t ic  U n d e r g r o u n d  Pipe. Set Up 
F o r F u r ro w  & S p r in k le r  I r r ig a t io n ,  A p p ro x . 3 3/ i  M ile s  P la s t ic  N a tu r a l G a s  L in e . NOTE: 7 8 7 . 6  A c re s  O f T h e  A b o v e  F a rm  Is  Now In  The CRP 
P ro g ra m  & H o w a rd  S h e lle y  W il l  R e c e iv e  V? O f C R P  P a y m e n ts  F o r  T e rm  O f C R P  C o n t ra c t ,  &  V< O f 1 9 8 8  Wheat Crop.
T E R M S : 1 0 %  In  E scro w  Day O f Sale , R e m a in d e r U p o n  C lo s in g . C L O S IN G : Soon A s P o ss ib le , A llo w in g  A d e q u a te  T im e  For All Paper Work With 
D ilig e n c e . T A X E S : 1 9 8 8  T axe s A s s u m e d  By B u y e r  & P a s t Y e a r T axe s  P a id  B y S e lle r . MINERALS: N o  M in e ra l Rights Will Be Conveyed.

TRACT lit -  TRACT I AND TRACT II COMBINED
h i d  I and Trad II Will 6« Sold Separate Then Complete. Whichever Brings The Most Will Be The Manner Of Sale.

In  Event B id  Is  R e je c te d  O n  R ea l Estate, All Equipment Will Be Sold Piecemeal Without Minimum Or Reservation. For More Information CaH: 
JAMES G. CRUCE (806) 296-7252 OR MERVIN EVANS (806) 293-8195

TRACTORS, HI-BOY -
1-1974 International 1166 Diesel Tractor, Cab, T.A., D.H., 

D.P.T.O., Weights. 18.4X38 Rubber
1-1968 International 855 Diesel Tractor, Cab, T.A., D.P.T.O., 

Weights, 18 4X38 Rubber
1-1959 John Deere 730 LPG Tractor. Cab, S.H., P.T.O,

3-pt., Weights. 18.4X30 Rubber
1—Moline G-1000 LPG Wheatland Tractor, D.H., 18.4X34 

Rubber
1—Barrentine Hi-Boy Spray Rig. Red Seal Motor, 12 Row 

Booms. 250 Gallon Tank (For Repair)
1-Case D C., LPG Tractor For Salvage
1—John Deere 1210 Gram Cart. 400 Bushel

EQUIPMENT -
1—John Deere 8 Row, 400 Rotary Hoe 
1-Lillis ton 6 Row Rolling Cultivator, 34X3H Bar 
1—Miller 16' Offset Disc 
1-Krause 14', Model 968, Disc 
1—Tractor Mount Cement Mixer, 3-pt., P.T.O.
1-Hesston 2 Row Shredder, 3-pt.
1—John Deere 6 Row Lister Planter, Double 2 V  Bar, G.W 
1—John Deere 4 Row Lister Planter, Double 2 '* "  Bar, G.W. 
1—Aliis Chalmers 4 Row Shredder, 1000 RPM, D.T. (Needs 

Repair)
¡-C lipp e r 560 S, T.A. Dry Fertilizer Spreader, 540 P.T 0. 
l~ f,s r» r< ip  Camelback Float 

'  5—$M Spray Rig. 3-pt, 6 Row 8oom, 150 Gallon Tank
1 -  K & J 6 Row Crustbuster 
—International 6 Section Harrow

2— John Deere 4 Bottom Mouldboard Plows, OF.
1-L it t le  Terry 3-pt. Blade. 8'
*—John Deere ORA G'am Drill, With Fertilizer Box, D.D. 

Cylinder Control, Wheels Set 8ack, 20'X8", D.T.
3— John Deere Grain Drills, Lever Control. D.T.
[-J o h n  Deere S Row Rotary Hoe, D.T.
1—SM 3 Drill Hitch
l- S M  3-pt. Disc Ditch Euler
1— SM Belly Frame, With 250 Gallon Anhydrous Tanks
1— SM 6 Row Spray Rig, 500 Gallon Tank

IRRIGATION -
2— Olson 13 Tower Sprinkler Systems, Some Cylinders 

Missing,. Steel Wheels
16-0ison Transport Brackets, 7.50X11 Rubber, Moves O'scn

Sprinklers
4 -  ford 534 Irrigation Motors
1 -& :- iiei.ey 4" Centrifugal Pump With 4 X12' Steel Water do>. laid

2-Deming 8”  Lake Pumps, 12' With 2 Stage Bowls, 50 H P. 
Gearheads

2-Cooling Jackets, 8"
2 -  Fresno 8" Flap Valves 
1—Pipe Trailer, S.A., 30'
5-Surge Tanks For N.G. Engines, With Regulators

SWATHER CHOPPER, FORAGE WAGON, 
H A Y -
l-M assey Ferguson 35 Draper Swather, D.T, 540 P.T.O. 
1-Bear Cat Western Land Roller Flail 6' Chopper. 540 

P.T.O., D.T.
1-Foster Chaff Forage Wagon 
130-Round Bales. Cane Hay

TRAILERS, TANKS, PICKUP (Salvage) -
1—Ford 4 Wheel Trailer Chassis 
1 -B ig  12 Flatbed Trailer
1 - 500 Gallon LPG Tank On 4 Wheel Trailer, 250 PSI 
1-5G0 Gallon Fuel Tank & Stand 
1-30 0  Gallon Fuel Tank & Stand 
1—Ford Courier Pickup For Salvage

LIVEST0C1? EQUIP M E NT -
I —Lot T-Posts, Electric Fence Posts
1-Lo t Used Cedar Posts 6 - Round 3ale Feeders
7-Water Tanks. 8' ! Water Tank. 4'
3 -  Sheep Water Tanks. 12'
3 -  SM Steel Bulk Feeders. 15' On Skids 
1-Baker Calf Feeder, 8'
13-Stockmaster Feed Troughs. 12'
4 -  ELS Liquid Supplement Feeders
1-Lo t Panel Wire, 5 X16 I -L o t Wooden Hog Panels 
l-S M  Hog Water Tank, 500 Gallon 
1-Water Tank On Saddle. 1250 Gaiicn
1 -  Lot Wooden Feed Troughs. 3'X 12
2 -  Brower Round Hog Feeders. 80 Bushel
100-Railroad Crossties 1 -Lo t Highlme Posts. 10 -12' 
40-Highline Posts. 8 "X 25' 75-Highlme Posts. 10' X 36
1 -  3-pt. Posthole Digger For Repair
2 -  Brahman Cattle Oilers 1 -Lo t Wire. Various Kinds

TOOL MAKEUPS -
¡-H am by 2 ! Tool Carrier, D.S.8
1 -  Hamby 21' Tool Carrier. T S B
2— Sets Hamby Gauge Wheels
9—Hamby 1X3 Shanks 12-Hamby ’ *X3 Fert Shanks

21-Hamby Clamps, 4X1 1-Hamby 3-pt. Hitch
13-Hamby Deep Ripper Shanks
1 -L o t Spacers, Various Kinds & Sizes
3 -Q u ick  Hitches 2-John Deere, 1-Lee
1-Tool Carrier, 2 '< " 8ars, Spacers
1 -S e t Row Markers, 9 Row
1—Set Axle Duals For Ford 18 4X28
1-S e t 18.1X38 Snap-On Duals
1-S e t 15.5X38 Snap-On Duals
1 -S e t Noble Insecticide Boxes
1 -L o t Sweeps 1 -L o t Hydraulic Cylinders
1 -L o t John Deere & Moline Lister Beams. Bottoms
7—John Deere Front-End Capacity Weights

NON CLASSIFIED -
l -S M  3-pt. Lift
1 -L o t Posthole Diggers. Shovels, Garden Hose. Tamp Bars 
1 —LPG Filler Hose 1 -L o t Tires, Wheels. V S
1 -  Lot Re-Bar 1-Canopy Roll Guard Top
6—10 X16' Steel Culverts 1 -3 0  Gal. LPG Tank. 250 PSI
2— Trailer House Axles

SEE NEXT PAGE FOR CONTINUATION OF 
THIS BIG 2 DAY SALE! PLEASE MAKE 
INSPECTION OF REAL ESTATE & SEED 
PROCESSING PLANT PRIOR TO SALE.

Five SUm Auduwem
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HOUSES (To Be Moved),
STORAGE SHED -
1-S ing le Family Residence 26 X50' (App-c» 1300'), 3 

Bedrooms, Family Room. Living Rod1* 1 Bathrooms. 
Kitchen, 2 Car Garage, Utility Room. Carpet. Central 
Heating. Wood Frame, Composition Roof 

1—Single Family Residence. 28 X40' (Approx. 1120'). 3 
Bedrooms. Living Room, 1 Bath, Wood frame (Needs 
Repair)

1-Storage Building, !5 'X30', Sheet Iron & Wood Frame 
1—Garage Building, 14 X24', Wood Construction

PAY LOADER, FORK LIFT, 40 TON TRUCK 
CRANE, CEMENT TRUCK, TRUCKS, 
TRAILERS -
1-Hough H65C Diesel Pay Loader, Cab. 3 Yard Bucket 
1—Datsun 6000 Diesel fork Lift 
1—Marion Truck Crane 120' Boom & Jib 
1 -19 65 Crane Carrier Cement Truck, 6 V Detroit, Twin 

Screw, T.A Allison Trans., With Challenger 7 Yard Mixer 
1—1972 Freigh.liner Truck Tractor, 318 Detroit Diesel, 10 

Speed Trans, Cabover, Twin Screw, T.A.
1-19 73  Chevrolet Grain Truck. 427 Engine, 5-2 Trans., 18' 

8ed & Hoist, 40' Sides (Trans. Needs Repair)
1 -19 72  Ford Truck, With 20' Van Box (Motor Thrashed) 
1 -1 9 /7  Gurthrie 45' Triple Deck Cattle Trailer 
1 -19 79  Wilson 40' Hopper Bottom Grain Trailer, T.A. 
1 -19 79  Lufkin 45' Float Trailer, With Side Kit 
1—American 34' Grain Trailer, 50" Sides (For Repair)

ALUMINUM STORAGE VANS -
1 -8  X40 Aluminum Storage Van Box 
1 —Trailmobrle Under Carriage Chassis 
1 -8  X20' Aluminum Storage Van Box 
1—8'X 16' Fiberglass Men's & Women’s Portable Toilet

GRAIN DRYER, GRAIN AUGERS,
DUMP PIT, VACUUM GRAIN MOVER -
1—G.T. Tox-0-Wik, Model 570, Portable Gram Dryer 
1-Bazooka 8 "X53' Portable Grain Auger, Electric Drive 
1-Bazooka 8 "X 50' Portaole Grain Auger. Electric Drive
7-Speed King 8"X60' Portable Grain Augers, P.T.O. Drive 
1-Speed King 6 "X 25' Portable Grain Auger 
1-Speed King 6"X60' Portable Grain Auger
1— Hutchinson 6' Portable Electric Auger
3-G ra in Augers, 4 "X12'
2 -  Elevator Legs, 14'. With Motors

1-Porch Metal Gram Dump. 10 X12 (Out Of Ground)
1—Neuero Vacuum Gram Mover, Model 675, 540 P.T.O.

SCALES, SEWING CONVEYOR, STONE 
CATCHER, SEED CLEANER -
l-H o w e  G17 Bagging Scale 
1—Toledo Scale, 125 Pound Capacity (Large Dial) 
l-0 tta u s , Mode! 700. Balance Scale, 2610 Gram 
1-fairbanks-Morse Scale, 175 Pound Capacity (Large Dial) 
1-Bushel Scale ¡ —Gram & Ounce Scale
1—Union Special Bag Closer On Pedestal, With 8 Conveyer 
1-Large Dewalt Electric Radial Arm Saw
1 -  Lockweed Sewing Conveyor, Power feed
2 -  Sets Portable Scisso* Scaffolds
1-New Seed Cleaner, Double Drum. Stone Catcher 
1 -N ew  3-Way Gate Grain Divider (For Leg)
1-O liver H.C Gravity Separator. Model 240, A-Hopper 

Bottom Tank, Scales & Sacking Unit 
1-C lipper Super X298D Seed Cleaner

OFFICE EQUIPMENT -
3 -  Desks, Various Sizes 3—4 Drawer Filing Cabinets
1-S tencii Cutter 1-Diagraph Stencil Machine
1—Didgraph, Mode! 7700, Inplant Label Printer
1 -3 M  Copy Machine. Model 516
1—Lot Pictures 1 -L o t Shelves, Chairs
1— Electric Typewriter
2 -  Space Heaters: 1-Sears, 1-Dearborn (1 Has Thermostat) 
1-Set 3 Door Metal Lockers 1-Motomco Moisture Meter

WELDERS, ELECTRIC MOTORS, 
COMPRESSOR -
1 -M ille r Blue Star Electric Portable Welder-Generator 
1-L inco ln  Welder, 250 Amp.
1 -2 0 0  Gal H.D. Commercial 10 H P Elect, Compressor
1-  Acetylene Cutting Torch
2 -  10 H P. Rebuilt Electric Motors
1-Large Lot Electric Motors, Various Sizes

STEEL, WOOD BEAMS, PALLETS, 
BARRELS -
1—Large Lot I-Beam, Various Sizes, Various Lengths
1-Large Lot Angle & Channel Iron
1 -L o t Rebar 1 -Lo t Elevator Leg, 7” X 20’
1 -L o t Tank Plating 1 -L o t Steel Mesh Wire
100-6"X16 ’X 75’ Laminated Wood Beams
35-6 "X16"X35’ Laminated Wood Beams

1-Large Lot 2 "X 6 " T & G Lumber 
1 -L o t Used Lumber 1-Large Lot Wood Pallets
1 -L o t Plastic Pallets - 1
1-Large Lot 30 & 55 Gallon Barrels

METAL ROUND GRANARIES -
3 -  5000 Bushel Round Granaries, With 5 H.P. Electric 

Motors & Augers
6 -3 0 0 0  Bushel Round Granaries. With 5 ti H.P. Electric 

Motors & Augers 
1 -20 00  Bushel Round Granary

NON-CLASSIFIED, CEMENT -
1-Lot Aeration Pipe 1-Lot Scoops. Shovels, Forks 
1-Lot Dolly Carts 1 -B & 0  714" Circular Saw
I -  Lot Sacks. Bags 1-Lot Hand Tools
330-Bags Portland Cement. 50 Pound Bags

S E E D -
682-Bags White Wonder Millet 
152-Bags Hybrid Pearl Millet 
666-Bags Hegri 36-Bags Mustang Wheat
22-Bags Hybrid Forage Sorghum 
104-Bags Early Sumac 
22-Bags Cow Honey 
119-Bags Hairy Vetch 
50 Bags Pinto Beans 
18-Bags Pella Soybeans 
125-Bags Hybrid H.S. 70 Grain Sorghum
34- Bags Hybrid H.S. 62 Grain Sorghum
166-Bags H.S. 80 96-Bags Ring Around
173-Bags H.S 62 & 70 Blend
1524-Bags H.S. 80. 33 & 2737
1792-Bags Cattle Call III 34-Bags Green Leaf Sudan
1697-Bags Range Boss 90% Hybrid
35- Bags Range Boss 615-Bags Hulled Bermuda
270-Bags Sorghum Alum 15-Bags Ermello Lovegrass 
17-Bags Gulf Annual Rye Grass
I I - Bags Corousian Blue Stem 25-Bags Oro-T. Extra
8-Bags Kleingrass 10-Bags Buffalo Grass
25-Bags Russian Beardless Wheat
17-Bags Hybrid Corn 39-Bags Male Sterile

BIRD FEED -
337-Bags German R-Millet, 41-Bags Rape. 50 Pound 
2103-Bags White Wonder, 50 Pound 
89-Bags Canadian Field Peas, 50 Pound
4 -  Bags Thistle (Niger), 90 Pound 
42-Bags Hybrid Pearl. Millet. 50 Pound

54-Bags Rox Orange 
22-Bags, Sterile Hybrid 
2-Bags Common Alfalfa 
14-Bags Liberty Alfalfa 
77-Bags William 79 Soybeans
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UIL Winners

by Kristi Blake

Results of the 1AA UIL 
Contest.

Team totals are First 
Gurver, 290; 2nd White 
Deer, 271; 3rd Stratford, 
270.

Those placing include: 
Lucy Cano, 1st Spelling; 
Kristyn Altman, 1st Ready 
Writing, 3rd Persuasive 
Speaking; Jamie Randall and 
Heather Carter, 1st Cross-Ex 
Debate; Sami Oakley, 2nd 
Prose; Cristie Chumley, 2nd 
Spelling and 2nd Cross-Ex 
Debate; Michelle Decker, 
2nd Cross-Ex Debate; Ste­
ven Batis, 2nd Poetry; Scott 
Riffe, 2nd Informative 
speaking; Wes Allison, 2nd, 
Persuasive; Becky Young, 
3rd Literary Criticism, 4th 
Feature Writing, 6th Ready 
Writing; Neal Smith, 3rd 
Persuasive; Thad Parson and 
Tim Hudson, 3rd Cross - Ex 
Debate; Kay Lynne Spurlock 
4th L.D. Debate; Lori Blair, 
4th Poetry; Parker Johnson, 
5th Informative; Jon Engel- 
brecht, 5th Number Sense; 
Kim Morris, 6th Typewrit-
lnS: l o K t P b  Blake _ 6th 
H ©ad I in ©s. . . i

Places first through third 
advance to Regionals. Fourth 
places are Regional Alter­
nates.

Competing but not placing 
were Wayne Stacy, Loyd 
Willard, Julie Young, Bobby 
Chesher, Carla Crabtree, 
Lisa O’Brien, Steve O’Brien, 
Sharon Meyer, and Tamara 
Johnson.

DCCW Held Spring 
Ladies Convention

The Diocesan Council of 
Catholic Women (DCCW) 
held their Spring Ladies 
Convention at St. Joseph’s 
Catholic Church Monday, 
March 21, 1988.

Members of the DCCW 
from at least six surrounding 
towns attended.

Entertainment was pro­
vided by several Stratford 
Junior High Band members: 
Paul David, Tuba Solo; 
Shannon Norris, Trumpet 
Solo; Carrie Switzer, Jenny 
Carter, Buffy Ellison, Emily 
Graham, Flute Quartet; Mrs. 
Betty Ingham, Band Direc­
tor.

The Olympic symbol is five interlocking circles colored blue, yellow, 
black, green and red on a w hite background, representing the five conti­
nents. At least one of these colors appears in the national flag of every 
country.

All-District Basketball players are: Back row Vicky Rolen, Susan Cloyd, Neal 
Smith, front Is Gared McBryde, Dirk Davis, Kim Morris and Doug Pittman.

The U.S. had three presidents in each of tw o  years: Van Buren, Harrison and Tyler in 1841; Hayes, Garfield and 
Arthur in 1881.

M ost of the 100 million meteors 
that enter the Earth's atmosphere 
each day burn up and filter down  
to Earth as dust. The total w eight 
of this dust that falls in one year is 
estimated to  be four million tons.

The first fire fighting organization 
in America was started in Philadel­
phia.* ■ ' ■■ • - ■

IN IS  AD SH O U ID N TB I HERE 

YOURSSHOULD I
Buy fh if space to lot everyone know 

what you have to offor.

Call The Stratford Star 

396-5885

# • • •

Emergency F arm Loan
Applications Being Accepted

Applications for emergen­
cy farm loans for losses 
caused by Blizzard and 
Freeze from March 17 to 29, 
1987 are being accepted at 
the Farmers Home Adminis­
tration (FmHA) office locat­
ed in Dumas, Texas, FmHA 
County Supervisor Philip R. 
Clayton, said today.

Sherman, Moore, and 
Hutchinson counties are 
three of the six counties in 
Texas recently named by 
Secretary of Agriculture 
Richard E. Lyng as eligible 
for loans to cover part of 
actual production losses 
resulting from the Blizzard 
and Freeze.

Mr. Clayton said farmers 
may be eligible for loans of 
up to 80 percent of their 
actual losses or the operating 
loan needed to continue in 
business or $500,000.00,

whichever is less. For 
farmers unable to obtain 
credit from private commer­
cial lenders, the interest rate 
is 4.5 percent.

‘As a general rule, a 
farmer must have suffered at 
least a 30 percent loss of 
production to be eligible for 
an FmHA emergency loan,”  
Mr. Clayton said. Farmers 
participating in the PIK or 
Federal Crop Insurance 
programs will have to figure 
in proceeds from those 
programs in determining 
their loss.

“ Applications for loans 
under this emergency des­
ignation will be accepted 
until November 8, 1988 but 
farmers should apply as soon 
as possible. Delays in 
applying could create back­
logs in processing and 
possibly over into the new

farming season,”  Mr. Clay­
ton said.

FmHA is a credit agency 
of the U.S. Department of 
Agriculture. It is authorized 
to provide emergency loans 
to recognized farmers who 
work at and rely on farming 
for a substantial part of their 
living. Eligibility is
extended to individual farm­
ers who work at and rely on 
farming for a substantial 
part of their living. 
Eligibility is extended to 
individual farmers who are 
U.S. citizens and to farming 
partnerships, corporations or 
cooperatives in which U.S. 
citizens hold a majority 
interest.

The FmHA office in 
Dumas is located at 801 
Bliss, Suite 104, and is open 
from 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
Monday through Friday.

v^YOUR TEA SIR

l .  - . —  ~    ■ ~ 7

Great Britain im ports 100 billion cups w orth  of tea each year.

"WITH 8 YEARS 
SENIORITY,
WE CAN
HIT THE GROUND 
RUNNING"
BOB PRICE KNOWS HIS WAY 
AROUND CONGRESS.
HE HAS MADE A LOT OF 
FRIENDS IN WASHINGTON, 
INCLUDING GEORGE BUSH. 
EIGHT YEARS SENIORITY 
WILL GIVE THIS DISTRICT 
CHOICE COMMITTEE SEATS.

C O M P A R E  TH E  C A N D ID A T E S  . .
PRICE M ILNER

Fourth Generation Farmer - Rancher - Cattleman iS
Oil and Gas Producer - Royalty Owner - 15 Years iS
Veteran U.S. Air Force Pilot with 27 Combat Missions
Builder and Supporter of Republican Party for 25 Years
U.S. Congressman 8 Years Seniority tS

State Senator - Finance Comm. & Nat'l Resources Comm. tS

Member U.S. House Agriculture Committee
Member U.S. House Armed Services Committee iS
Member U.S. House Space and Astronautics Committee iS
Experienced in World Affairs and World Trade V *

Original Sponsor of Prayer in Schools Bill V *

Member of A.A.R.P. and Caregiver for Carl White
90% Conservative Voting Record - 97% Attendance iS
Successful in Attracting New Industry and Jobs tS
Supported Nuclear Waste Dump Deaf Smith Co.
Worked for a Compromise to Increase the Sales Tax tS

Supported Utility Companies positions at Public Utilities Comm.

ACCOMPLISHMENTS:
Nominated Ronald Reagan for President 
Original Sponsor Prayer in School Amendment 
Sponsored Catastrophic/Long Term Health Care 
Sponsored 65 Year Old Outside Income Bill 
Alibates Flint Quarries National Monument 
Bell Helicopter -  650  Employees 
Greenbelt Water Pipeline Construction 
Iowa Beef Packers 2 600  Employees 
Lake Kemp Dam Improvement 
Lake Meredith National Recreation Area 
Offices in Amarillo, Pampa and Wichita Falls 
Paducah Water and Sewer Project 
Responsible for Amarillo Port of Entry 
Salt Water Project Pease River 
Started Advisory and Townhall Meetings 
Texas Tech Medical School 175 Students
T. S.T.I. 8 26  Students
U. S.A.F. Regional Hospital
Veterans Hospital Addition $ 1 8 ,0 0 0 ,0 0 0

POSITIONS ON ISSUES:
Reduce Defict by Reducing Foreign Aid 
Stop Trading with Terrorist Nations 
Reinstate 27'/j%  Depletion Allowance 
Eliminate Alternative Minimum Tax 
Keep Control of Panama Canal 
Support Strong Defense Program & S.D.I. 
Reduce Dependence on Foreign Oil 
Improve U.S. Agriculture Farm Programs 
Support Rural Hospital/Physician Program 
Implement Grace Comm. Recommendations 
Support Social Security Improvement Plan 
Eliminate Federal Funded Abortions 
Cut Government Regulations and Red Tape 
Stop Communism in Central America 
Reduce Government Waste and Reduce Taxes

PAST & PRESENT AFFILATI0NS
First Baptist Church Pampa 
Boy Scouts of America Silver Beaver 
Oklahoma State B.S. Degree 
Sigma Alpha Epsilon Fraternity 
32nd Degree Mason Kiva Shriner 
Kiwanis Past President 
V.F.W. American Legion Veteran 
National Cattlemans Association 
Texas & SW Cattle Raisers Association 
Texas Farm Bureau 
U.S. Air Force Association 
Former Members of Congress Association 
Vice President Reading State Bank 
Oirector Pampa Chamber of Commerce

Bob Price Can Represent 
Every Person And 
Every Town 
In  This D istrict. . .
Not Just Amarillo

FOR CONGRESS
TOUGH • EXPERIENCED •  CONSERVATIVE

PAID POL. ADV.

CONTINUE THE REAGAN AGENDA VOTE BUSH - BOULTER - PRICE APRIL 1



8  THE STRATFORD STAR*THURSDAY,MARCH 31,1988

Rodeo Time Speech Club

Mel

PHILLIPS
Mel Phillips Is The Only Candidate Who...
★ ISA  SMALL BUSINESSMAN — NOT ANOTHER ATTORNEY
★ GREW UP AND ATTENDED PUBLIC SCHOOL IN THIS AREA
★ HAS A UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS DEGREE IN GOVERNMENT
★ WAS A UNITED STATES NAVY PILOT

MEL’S OPPONENT 
ENDORSED BY:

Mel
PHILLIPS

This cowgirl did a great job running the poles.

by Kristi Blake
Stratford’s One Act Play, 

“ Alice’s Adventures in 
Wonderland’ ’ , played to a 
very receptive audience at 
Panhandle, Texas last Tues­
day. Though outgunned by 
three heavy dramas (White 
Deer, Gruver and West 
Texas High), “ Alice”  gar­
nered Best Actor; Duane 
Mungia, the White Rabbit? 
All-Star Cast; Leigh Bass, 
Alice, and Honorable Men­

tion; Kristyn Altman, the 
White Queen.

Other cast members 
included: Sami Oakley, The 
Red Queen; Cristie Chum- 
ley, Duchess and Sister; Lori 
Wiley, the Cook; Trisha 
Tillery, Cheshire Cat and 
Soldier; Michelle Decker, 
Tweedledee and Soldier; 
Jamie Randall, Tweedledum 
and Soldier; Bobby Chesher, 
Mad Hatter; Wes Alison,

March Hare; Don Àduddell, 
Dormouse; Kristi Blake, 
Queen of Hearts; Steven 
Batis, King of Hearts and 
Darren Pittman, Knave of 
Hearts.

Brenda McClellan, One 
Act Play Director, stated, 
“ I believe this is one of the 
best shows I have ever done. 
There were no weak 
characters. I was so proud of 
all of them!”

The Pacific Ocean is the largest and deepest ocean. It covers about 
63,800,000 square miles, more than one third of the world's surface.

ENDORSED BY:
TEXAS FARM BUREAU 
AMERICAN AGRICULTURE 
TEXAS SUGAR BEET GROWERS 
TEAMSTERS LOCAL 577 
CANADIAN RECORD 
BORGER NEWS HERALD 
WELLINGTON LEADER 
AMARILLO GLOBE NEWS 
CANYON NEWS 
FRIONA STAR 
BOVINA BLADE 
TULIA HERALD 
CHRISTIAN TIMES WEEKLY 
HALE COUNTY AMERICAN

GET OUT AND VOTE.

WE CAN NOT LET JUST 
AMARILLO DECIDE WHO 

OUR NEXT STATE 
SENATOR WILL BE.

This young cowboy from the morning Kindergarten class is out of the chute, 
going to rope his calf.

AMARILLO CENTRAL LABOR 
COUNCIL 

T EXAS AFL-CIO 
TEAMSTERS LOCAL 577

District UIL winners, 5th and 6th grade, front row, 1st Sarah Graham, 4th 
Oscar Baeza in Number Sense, Holly Husmann tied for 5th in Listening, 
Mandy Mires 5th place Team in Picture Memory, Peggy Ford, Jennifer 
Newcomb, Ashley Parsons, Pati Porras, Sheila Fedric, and Leah Shuping 3rd 
place team in Music Memory, 7th and 8th grade Emily Graham second place 
writing, Jennifer Haynes 3rd Place, oral reading, Greg Vandiver 2nd Number 
sense, Josh Marshall 3rd in Number Sense, Shannon Norris 6th Number 
Sense and Matt Brotherton 4th in science.

Employee Of Month 
Cont. From Page 2
Dy.

Dorene’s husband is 
Henry and he is employed by 
Monfort.

Dorene says “ she enjoys 
doing aerobics and has 
faithfully done some type of 
physical fitness for several 
years. She also enjoys 
reading and sewing and 
attends a woman’s Bible 
study group and finds the 
more she studies the more 
she needs to learn.”

“ I appreciate being nomi­
nated and chosen Employee 
of the Month. I feel this is a 
real honor and count myself 
lucky to work at a job that is 
both interesting and chal­
lenging. Insurance is a 
complicated business that 
requires continous educa­
tion. Our Agency recently 
purchased a computer. I feeK 
this will be a big help in 
giving prompt service and 
keep us up to date. I am 
committed to a job that 
allows me to be around 
people and I find that a great 
experience.”

Sharon Brown stated: 
‘Dorene is a very knowledg­
eable, hardworking, cheerful 
employee. She is a joy to 
work with and we .consider 
her a great asset to our 
business.”

Since safety belts are a part of the car, they start losing speed as soon as the car 
does. In a crash or a quick stop your body slams against the belts and begins to 
slow down with the car. This is called “ ride down.”

So basically, safety belts prevent injuries by eliminating the “ second” and "th ird” 
collisions with the dash, steering wheel, windshield, roof, or another occupant.

The Safety Belt: How It Works
.. Safety belt can move

"  “ *n”  anrl “ nut”
Bar

Beit
Belt

Safety belt cannot 
move “out”

Pendulum 
Ratchet Mechanism
U n d e r n o rm a l c o n d itio n s , the pendulum 
and bar are in their rest positions. The reel, 
which  holds the belt, is free to rotate. A s  the 
occupant moves forward the belt moves un­
restrained with the occupant.

¿ =  Bar

Ratchet Mechanism Pendulum 
U n d e r em erg e n cy  c o n d itio n s , such a s in 
a collision, the pendulum moves forward 
under the force of the impact causing the bar 
to engage the ratchet. The reel and safety belt 
now lock in place and the occupant is held 
firmly in place.

Texas Law
The Texas mandatory safety belt law was effective September 1. 1985. Fines 

began December I, 1985.

The law:
. Applies to passenger cars and trucks including %  ton.

. Requires drivers and front seat passengers to use safety belts.

. Drivers are responsible for passengers at least 4 years old but less than 15 years 
old. (Passengers from birth to 2 years old are already required to be in federally 
approved child safety seats, and children from 2 years old up to 4 years old are 
already required to be in the child safety seats or safety belts.

. Carries a fine of $25 to $50.

. Exempts postal workers in box-to-box delivery.

. Exempts a person on medical grounds, with a written statement from a licensed 
• • physician stating that for medical reasons the person is unable to wear a safety belt. 

. Provides that use or nonuse of a safety belt is not admissible evidence in a civil trial.

[Public Service Announcement from the Stratford Police 
Department and Stratford Star]

ATTENTION FARMERS
April 15,1988 it Iff last day to jasara 
1987 Croia Sorghum mid Corn andar 

SCIC or
for moro information contact

Roy J. Mi Box 621 Stntfonl, Tomos 79064 
906494-2067

NO STATE INCOME TAX
POL. ADV. PAID BY MEL PHILLIPS FOR STATE SENATOR COMMITTEE. 514 SOUTH POLK, AMARILLO, TX 79101, DENNIS CLOUNCH, TREASURER
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Susie Spurlock

Partners In The Kitchen 
Workshop To Begin

Partners in the Kitchen, a 
4 part parent-child cooking 
class will be conducted 
during the month of April for 
children and their parents, 
ages 6-9 (1-3 school grades).

Workshop participants 
will learn how to make soft 
pretzels, fajitas, easy snacks 
and microwave cooking in 
addition to learning more 
about nutrition and food 
safety.

The workshops will be 
held April 5, 12, 19, and 26 
from 6:30 - 8:00 p.m. at the 
County Extension Office 
Meeting Room.

Sponsored by the Sherman 
County Extension Home 
Economics Committee and 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service, the work­
shops are designed to teach 
basic nutrition knowledge,

safety, and promote wise 
food selection and increase 
communication skills be­
tween parents and children.

Class size is limited. 
Enroll by calling the 
Sherman County Extension 
Office at 396-2122. 
Enrollment deadline is 
March 31.

Educational Programs 
conducted by the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice serve people of all ages 
regardless of socio-economic 
level, race, color, sex, 
religion, or national origin. 
References to commercial 
products or trade names are 
made with the understand­
ing that no discrimination is 
intended and no endorse­
ment by the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service is 
implied.

Extension Educational Project Art News

Elaine Mazlish
An Extension educational 

project designed to help 
youths develop healthy 
self-esteem will be explained 
in Amarillo Saturday after­
noon, April 9, in a workshop 
conducted by the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice.

Adele Faber
The workshop is for 

teachers, counselors and 
professional or volunteer 
leaders of youths in the third 
- eighth grades, says Susie 
E. Spurlock, Sherman Coun­
ty Extension Agent for home 
economics. It will be held 
from noon until 3 p.m. at

Amarillo High School, Ful­
ton and Bell Avenue.

The Workshop will climax 
two days of special training 
for youth counselors and 
parents being conducted 
April 8-9 in Canyon and 
Amarillo. The training is 
under auspices of West 
Texas State University, 
Region 16 of the Texas 
Education Agency, The 
Amarillo Independent School 
District and the Extension 
Service.

The training Friday (April 
8) and Saturday morning 
(April 9) will feature 
conferences and workshops 
led by award winning 
authors Adele Faber and 
Elaine Mazlish, of New 
York, they are ranked among 
the top writers in the field of 
childcare. Their works 
include the books “ Liberated 
Parents-Liberated Children,’ 
“ How to Talk So Kids Will 
Listen and Listen So Kids 
Will Talk,”  and “ Siblings 
Without Rivalry.”

Friday they will confer 
with counselors during 
sessions at West Texas State 
University. Friday night 
they will conduct a public 
program from 7-9 p.m. at 
Bonham Junior High School, 
5600 West 49th, Amarillo. 
Another public program will 
be conducted from 9 a.m. 
until noon, Saturday at 
Amarillo High.

Saturday afternoon, from 
noon until 3 p.m., the
Extension service will intro­
duce counselors and youth 
leaders from across the 
Panhandle to a lesson series 
designed to help youth 
develop a healthy self - 
image.

This “ It’s Up To Me”  
project is a 10-lesson series 
in Extension’s 4-H Program 
which is adaptable to church, 
classroom and other youth 
groups, said Dr. Judy Flynn, 
district Extension director at 
Amarillo. One level is aimed 
at third-fifth grade ages; a 
second level is for sixth - 
eighth grade ages.

The April 9 training will 
explain the project, which 
uses a lesson plan format 
with activities for each

Prospectus 
Study Club

SEE YOUR1 
DOCTOR

‘ d p

GFWC/Prospectus Study 
Club did well at Top of Texas 
District Convention held 
March 25-26 at Amarillo 
Sheraton Hotel. Attending 
were club president, Janet 
Riffe; Margaret Reed, State 
Education Chairman; Oline 
Caraway, Chairman, Texas 
Women’s Library Divison; 
Marylou McDaniel, GFWC 
Centennial Celebration; and 
club members Betty Brown, 
Lorraine Mehner, Mattie 
Baskin.

Poetry written by Mary 
Hill, Associate Member and 
Mrs. Caraway were read at 
Friday night’s banquet by 
Marylou McDaniel. Mrs. 
Hill won first and third for 
“ What ?? Centennial?”  and 
“ Life’s Changes” . Mrs. 
Caraway was second with 
“ Walk With Hope” . These 
were sent on to State.

Ten awards were won in 
Arts & Crafts. Awarded to 
Mary Lou Cotney were a first 
and second for oil paintings. 
Mary Hill received two firsts 
and a second for an oil and 
two watercolors. Joyce Hart 
won a first for decorative

lesson. A teacher-leader 
guide will be provided.

The lessons include: 
Accepting yourself; accept­
ing others; living with 
yourself; talking, listening 
and learning; dealing with 
peer pressure; developing 
potential; making decisions 
and solving problems; sett­
ing goals; competing instead 
of comparing, and being 
yourself-your best self.

Registration for the “ i t ’s 
up To Me”  session must be 
made by April 1 with local 
county Extension offices. 
Please call 396-2122 or 
396-2081, your Sherman 
County Extension Office. 
The registration fee of 
$10.00 includes lunch and 
complete project notebook 
and leader’s guide.

pillows. Joyce Ann Lasley 
received a second and third 
in china painting. Janet
Riffe won a second and third 
for decorative wreaths. Only 
three places were awarded in 
a category.

The club was named 
Outstanding Club in the 
district with a Scorecard 
totaling 424, the nearest 
having 379. The Yearbook 
placed third but was sent to 
State also.

The Club received first in 
programs for Literature & 
Drama, School Issues, Girls- 
town, Trade & Aid.

Projects receiving firsts 
were Education: Literacy 
emphasis, Continuing Edu­
cation, Leadership, Health, 
Trade & Aid, Today’s 
Living, Conservation Em­
phasis; Literature & Drama, 
Texas Women, Community 
Improvement Program, 
GFWC Centennial Celebra­
tion.

Seconds in Programs were 
Arts: Special Emphais,
Leadership, Stop Elderly 
Abuse. Projects were School 
Issues, Girlstown, outstand­
ing Club Program/Project.

This is a total of 36 awards 
for the club.

Breast Cancer:
Are You At Risk?
By Gloria Frankl, M.D.
Radiology Department 

Los Angeles Kaiser Permanente 
Medical Center

In the past, certain factors such 
as family history, age, diet and 
childhearing (breastfeeding), were 
used to identify those women consi­
dered at high risk for developing 
breast cancer. It is clear today that 
just being a woman is the most im­

portant risk factor.
Studies have shown 

that 80 percent of 
women who get breast 
cancer do not have a 
family history of the 
disease. One-third of 
breast cancers occur 

in women aged 50 and under, and 
the incidence of breast cancer is ris­
ing, particularly in younger 
women. These days, one in ten 
women will get breast cancer.

Fortunately, there is good news 
about breast cancer. There is an x- 
ray method called screening mam­
mography, which can detect breast 
cancer at its earliest stages. “Screen­
ing” refers to mammography for 
women without lumps or symptoms. 
Only mammography can detect 
breast lesions too small to be felt. 
When breast cancers are detected 
at this very early stage, the chances 
of survival— and avoiding mastec­
tomy— are excellent.

Today, every woman over 35 
should ask her doctor about screen­
ing mammography. The author 
prefers xeromammography, which, 
in her experience, has saved lives 
and saved breasts for manv women

Best wishes to everyone for a happy and 
holy holiday. May you and your loved ones 

be honored with much joy and many blessings, too*

... ........... I ■■■Hill

Double coupons 
Wed. & Sot. 

Free Delivery

- mmn mm Store Hours

M on.-Sot. 7 A M - 8 PM  

Sun. 12-6 PM

k s

CHICKEN 
OFTHE SEA

TUNA
m 01 CAN l

WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD

- . C a t  
C h o w

PURINA

CAT CHOW
1 2 9

4 LB. 
BAG

WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD

40 a .

FABERIC 
SOFTNER

BOUNCE
89*

WITH ONE FILLED BONUS BUCK CARD
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IT PAYS TO LOOK IN , THE

★  FORSAlt *
For Sale: 2-HD 800 Moline 
irrigation engines, recently 
overhauled. Have been run 
two seasons. 384-2277. 
___________________ 4-7-c

For Sale: Extra clean 1981, 
98 Oldsmobile, 4 door, 
loaded call 396-5978 or 
396-5308.
________________ 11-26-tfn

G & W Industrial has Faucet 
Seats as well as a full line of 
plumbing supplies.
_______  3-17-tfn

For Sale: 1-15 month old 
registered female Schnauzer 
$75.00 384-2277.

_______________ 4-7-c
For Sale: Plain Bluestem 
Grass seed priced to sell. 
Call Chris Mackey, Sayre, 
Okla. 405-928-2247 or 405- 
928-3729
___________ _______3-31-p
For Sale: pipe, all sizes 1 1/2 
inch to 16 inch, over 80 tons, 
reasonable, Norman 
Malcolm 753-4432.

3-31 -c

“ Final Mark Down”
40% off on winter 

coats and long sleeve 
shirts at

THE General Store

__________________ 3-31-c

For Sale: 1975 Chev. pickup. 
Recently overhauled., 454 
engine. Good farm or work 
pickup 384-2277.

4-7-c

New Summer Shipment 
at

THE General Store 
Shirts, Shorts, Jams 
with Tops to match 

__________________ 3-31 -c

Spring has arrived at Elk 
Pharmacy. Easter Candy, 
baskets and novelty items 
just right to assist the Easter 
Bunny. Check daily sales on 
Easter items.
__________________ 3-31-c

FOR SALE: Honda SL70, 
$100.00 and 2 nice sport 
jackets for young man and 1 
suit. Call 396-5829. 
___________________ 4-7-c
FOR SALE: Four 1980 model 
6580 Electro Gator Pivots 
located in Sherman County, 
Texas. If interested call First 
National Leasing Omaha, 
Ne. 1-800-228-4411, Ext. 
7912.
___________________ 4-7-c

LAND FOR SALE 
RIVER FRONT 

LAND BARGAIN 
Pre 4* acre riverfront with 
large mature trees. Front 
paved road near West 
Columbia. Ideal for vacation 
or permanent home. Owner 
will finance with small down 
payment. Total price $19,200 
Call 409-345-6130 Anytime. 
___________________ 4-7-c

PIANO FOR SALE 
WANTED: Responsible par­
ty to assume small monthly 
payments on piano. See 
locally. Call credit manager 
1-800-447-4266 
_________________ 4-14-p

★  /MANUFACTURED ★  
HOMES

ABANDONED HOMES 
Take over payments on 2 and 
3 bedroom homes.

QUALIFY BY PHONE 
806-381-1352 

CALL COLLECT
10-1-tfn

After Charles Lindburgh made his­
tory with the first solo flight across 
the Atlantic, he came home by ship.

★  SERVICES ★
Cowboy Cafe At Conlen 

Breakfast starting at 6:30 
Daily Luncheon Special 

Good Ol’ Country Cookin’ 
384-2124

________________ 10-22-tfn

Durans Disc 
Rolling Service 

35 years experience 
No Mileage charged 

405-423-7238
2-5-9-tfn

For Termite Control 
Call Leo Russell 

at 1-383-7075 Amarillo. Have 
been working Stratford for 
28 years. Have City and 
State Liscense for the City of 
Stratford.

______ 4-24tfn
Give the lady at your house a 
break. Toil her to let us do 
your laundry this week. You 
will always rate high here, 
but more important you will 
be #1 at home. Stratford Poly 
Clean 396-2151. 
___________________ 2-4-c

Come by for a free Halon fire 
extinguisher demonstration. 
I’ve also got smoke detectors 
for your home. Call or come 
by. Bill Riffe 396-5541.

__________  9-24-tfn

Bridal selections for Kristi 
Buckles and Merritt Otto at 
Girls Next Door. 
_________________ 2-25-tfn

We would appreciate the 
Opportunity to discuss your 
CRP grass seed needs. All 
varieties available. Call 
GRASS SEED SERVICES: 
806-385-5229.
Nights:Tommy Thrash-395-
5357
Dick Hopping-385-3653 
Terry Thrash 385-4403 
__________________ 3-31-c

Would you allow me to show 
you what is available in 
Health Insurance. Your C.A. 
Representative, John 
Husmann 753-4426. 
_______ _________ 2-25-tfn

STYLE SHOW 
Feel free to stop in and see 
whats new. Begins at 2’ 0 
Clock Saturday April 2nd. 
Girls Next Door. 
__________________ 3-31-c

I can copy old Photos. Cali
396-2333.
__________________ 3-31-c

Bridal Selections for Kristi 
Buckles are at the Elk 
Pharmacy. Call us and let us 
help you with your selection. 
Free delivery to the sl ower 
April 2nd.

VETERANS-Needing assist­
ance in applying for 
pensions, compensation, 
schooling, hospitalization, 
and other VA benefits call 
Max Stephenson, CSO at 
396-5348.

4-28-p

Selection of beautiful bridal 
gifts for Kristi Buckles and 
Merritt Otto.Stainless Steel 
Flatware and many other 
gifts. Robbies Gift Shoppe. 

_________________3-31-c

LIVESTOCK WATER 
HAULING 

YEAR-ROUND
Call 396-5394 

__________________ 3-31-c
If you need your garden 
rototilled, call Jessie at
405-543-6341.

_____________ 5-5-c

The G.T. E. Local Service 
Agency presently at Ellie 
M ’s in Stratford will be 
relocated to THE General
Store at 217 Texas Street. 
Effective March 31, 1988.

_______________4-7-c

Rototilllng Call 396-2333.
3-31-c

The kangaroo rat, a tiny desert ro­
dent, has never been known to drink 
water, it gets all of the moisture it 
needs from desert roots and herbs.

★  MISCit
Headquarters 

Fish Fry Friday Night 
5:30 to 9:00 P.M.
All You Can Eat 

We are now open on 
Mondays 6:00 A.M. to 9:00 
P.M.

5-14-tfn

“Spring Is Around The 
Corner’’. You need to start 
thinking about crabgrass 
control. We also have 
fertilizers and chemicals. 
Everything for your yard 
needs. THE General Store.

2-18-tfn

G & W Industrial has Faucet 
Seats as well as a full line of 
plumbing supplies. 
_________________ 3-17-tfn
Own your own beautiful 
discount shoe store. Offering 
over 300 top designer name 
brands and over 2000 styles 
at unbelievable retail prices 
of 6.75 to 19.99 ‘ Gloria 
Vanderbilt ‘ Calico ‘ Bando­
line ‘ Andrew Geller *AI- 
malfi ‘ Bare Traps ‘ Liz 
Claiborne ‘ Bass *9 West and 
hundreds more. Your “ $’’ 
cash investment of $12,900. 
to $39,900. includes begin­
ning inventory, training and 
fixtures. Call Anytime. 
Prestige Fashions 1-800-247- 
9127.
______________3-31-p

Ron Page is back with Town 
West Ford in Amarillo. For 
all your car needs, new or 
used contact Ron Page, 
1-800-682-4103. 
__________________ 4-14-c
VO Storages #8 storage. 
Second of 2 publications for 
Non-Payment.
___________________ 4-7-c

★  GIVEAWAY ★
To Give away: 10 week old 
part Blue Healer, female 
puppy 384-2277.

4-7-c

CL A SSI FI EDS
‘THE BEST SALESPERSON AROUND’

Phone 396-5885 to place your Star classified ad

Classified Ad Rate i

16* per word a fte r 25 words 
$4.00 minimum up to 25 words 
16 cents each additional word first week

★  FOR RENT ★
Gillis Apartments for rent. 
Call 396-5564 or 396-2264. 
George Jeffcoat. Garrison at 
396-5657.
_________ 5-21-tfn

Clean 2 bedroom house for 
rent or sale. Call 396-2067. 
________________ 3-10-tfn

Have place for 1 or 2 horses. 
396-2067.
_________________ 3-10-tfn

3 bedroom brick home for 
rent. 420 N. Spruce call 
316-825-4068.
__________________ 3-31-c

1 bedroom house to rent, 
HUD inspected. For more 
information call Joyce Ann 
396-5911 or 396-2570.

3-31-c

*
¥
¥
¥
¥  g« per word on subsequent insertions 
J  $1.00 discount if paid in advance

Deadline Noon Mondays

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

★  HOUSES FOR SAIE ★  *  HELP WANTED ★
For Sale: Brick home. 
Fenced acreage and out­
buildings. 396-2067. 
________________ 11-26-tfn
FOR SALE: House to be 
moved, 1373 sq. ft. Built in 
oven and stove top. 396-5828 
late evenings. Bobby 
Edmond.

3-31-c

CHUCKLE CORNER

The Sherman County Exten­
sion Office is now accepting 
applications for part-time 
summer employment. Appli­
cations are available at the 
Extension Office. If you have 
questions, contact Jim Alli­
son or Carl Dretske.

3-31-c

GET PAID for reading 
books! $100.00 per title. 
Write: PASE-C1383, 161 S. 
Lincolnway, N. Aurora, II 
60542.

4-21-p

HELP WANTED 
GOVERNMENT JOBS 

$15,400-$72,500 
now hiring

EXCELLENT BENEFITS 
Call 504-649-7922 

Ext J-9195

3-31-p

NICE S U IT  VOÜ G O T !  VOU T 4IN K  
THE ST V L E  W IL L  COME B A C K  ? "

No. 874
RONALD TILLERY

Third Thondoy 
________ 8p.m.

■P

c l  J l a n c L  d o .
710 S. Dumas Ave. " 7 “T=T »35 73*4 MLS

Good Buy; Storm windows, covered porch, nice 3 Br. 
1 1/2 bath, only $20,000.
Nice 2 BR house on four lots with metal shop and 2 
mobil home hook ups. $24,500.
Reduced to $14,000. Cute 2 bedroom-big yard new 
paint-storage garage. New roof and storm windows.
Dollhouse on main! 3 bedroom, new paint and tile. 
$25,000. Spanish style stucco
Reduced to $76,000. Excellent floor plan-extra nice 3 
bedroom-3 bath-extra paved parking, lots of storage. 
New carpet-new paint-built in desk-walkin cedar 
closet-3 ceiling fans. $45,000.
Good location, 2 BR. carpet, cent, heat-regr., air, 
priced to sell, storm windows $30,000.00 
Super nice home. Lots of storage, Morton Building. 5 
lots on corner. 3 BR 1 % bath $75,000.00 
Good business opportunity, Lumber Yard, Stratford. 
Peachy Perfect Duplex. 2 car garage, corner lots, owner 
financing available. $30,000.00.
Good Buy, 3 bedroom, close to school, corner lot

House to be moved. fireplace, storm
windows and do r-o,000.

Pat Johnson 
396-2243 m

Tom Ferguson, Broker
Marty Bain 
396-2053

WOMEN'S CLINIC 

OF

DALHART

1422 Texas Boulevard 
Dalhart, Texas 79022

OLUMIDE MICHAEL 
MUGHELLI, MD

Board Certified OB/GYN

Office Hours

9-5 Mon. - Fri. 
Thursday evening 6-9

PHONE

806-249-4701

I need someone to operate a 
laundry and drycleaning 
plant. Experience is desira­
ble, but not absolutely 
necessary. Call or come by 
for application blank. Strat- 
Stratford Poly Clean 
396-2151.
__________________ 4-14-c
Wanted: Baby sitter for 8 
month old boy. Two nights a 
week from 4 p.m. to early 
morning. Come by Queen 
O’Cream 2-5 and ask for 
Charlotte Cooper. 
__________________ 3-31-c

WANTED: Babysitter in my 
home. $80.00 a week call
753-4447.

3-31-c

Alexander the Great made his 
soldiers keep clean-shaven so the 
enemy couldn't grab them by their 
beards.

ALCOHOLICS 
ANONYMOUS and 
AL-ANONmeet each 
Thursday at 8:00 p.m. 
in the old County  Barn

Michael Pad wick M .D .
Board Certified in Family Practice

9 a.m.-5 p.m. 
Mondays-Fridays 

Until 7 p.m. Wednesdays

Family Practice 
with Obstetrics 
Se Habla Español

201 South Bliss Dumas, Texas 935-7730

W illiam txepai se rv ice
Phone 396-2429

For Plumbing and Heating trouble 

Roof Repair and Home Remodeling 

Residential and Commercial

We Sell
Smith W ater Heaters 

Cozy Wall Heaters 

Heat Tape 

Kohler Fixtures 

Plumbing Supplies

Don Williams Cozy Floor Furnaces Eddie Williams 
Res. 396-2322 u -  . Res. 396-5330

Delta Faucets

'Si r

Family Vision 
Care

Specialists

Dr J .W . McCormick

M«i -Frt 1:104:00 
W l l i

Dumas- 935-6491
A » i r t c—  Op U n M t  

A *w c*uan I Eyewear 
Visual Analysis
Contact Lenses 
and Supplies

Dr. David Riddlesourger 
OPTOMETRISTS

Dr. McCormick will be in the Stratford Office:

Thursday, April 7 & April 21 call 935-6491 
Office Hours: 10:30 to 4:30 396-5516

HOME (806 ) 381-2212

DAN H. LOVING. D D S.. M .A  G.D.

GENERAL DENTISTRY 
Wednesday in Stratford

P.0 BOX 556 
212 S BLISS 

DUMAS, TEXAS 79029 
(806)935-9212

P O BOX 779 
212 N. POPLAR 

STRATFORD, TEXAS 79084 
(806)396-5866


