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3chool O p e n i n g
Enthusiastic Attendance at Pub- 
f :c School Monday, and at 

Academy Tuesday.

The school spirit was manifest 
in Floydada Monday morning 
\ hen a hundred patrons or more

ith some 250 students gathered 
S n the auditorium of the Public 
School with the teachers and 
the Board and the first exercises 
□f the 1912-13 term were begun.

The exercises were appropri- 
ite and enthusiastic throughout. 
The vast auditorium swelled 
with strains of sacred songs,and 
diss Marie Henry recited very 
leautifully.

Prof. Savage made a short and 
npressive opening talk and in 
roduced Prof. Yarborough who 
s beginning his first year’s 
vork in Floydada.

Following Mr. Yarborough, 
W. A. Robbins and Claude V. 
Hall, “hot air” dispensers for 
ihe board contributed some 
?ood thoughts on the line of the 
school work. Revs. G. W. Shear­
er, W. H. Matthews and G. I. 
Britain spoke impressively, the 
mtire congregation sang “Am- 
irica,”  and the school years 
work was begun.

An enrollment of 250 has been 
announced for the week and a 
number will enter later. 
Academy Starts Off  Strong.

The opening exercises at the 
Academy were not attended by 
so many people, but those who 
were enthusiastic over the pros­
pects and live talks were made 
by several parties. Rev. G. W. 
Shearer opened the second year’s 
work of the Academy in Floyd­
ada by reading scripture and a 
orayer for God’s blessings on 
the undertaking. Rev. Britain 
followed with a talk “ What is 
your Life” —a 15 minute talk 
full of forceful thought. ‘ ’Chis- 
tian Education,” by Rev. Shear­
er followed, and Miss Barrow 
rendered a classic selection at 
the piano. Mrs. Bailey and Miss 
Young each entertained the 
audience with a vocal solo, and 
readings, respectively, which 
were warmly applauded. W. A. 
Robbins, W. A. Gound, W. M. 
Masrie, C. Snodgrass and oth­
ers made appropriate talks.

In an interview Wednesday 
Dr. Bailey, president of the 
Academy said the management 
was well—pleased with the cor- 
iial interest shown by the peo- 
)le of Floydada and with the in- 
ireased attendance. As soon as 
possible the baths, sanitary 
plumbing, steam heating, acety- 
line lights, etc., will be install­
ed, and when this is done Floy­
dada Presbyterian Academy will 
be an up-to-date plant of which 
Floydada may well be proud— 
Floydada is already proud of 
The Academy for that matter. 
The fact that it is the only school 
of this church West of Fort 
Worth or North of Brownwwood 
means that the Presbyterian 
people are behind it and deter­
mined to make it a “go.”

Help Floydada Presbyterian 
Academy and it will help you.

Baptist Board Meeting.
The Executive Board of the 

Stakec? Plains Baptist Associa­
tion met in session in Baptist 
Church at Floydada Tuesday 
night and continued in session 

throughout the entire day Wed 
nesday.

The following Board members 
were present, Viz: Rev. H. H. 
Street, Rev. Forbes, R. M. Irick, 
Jno. G Hamilton, of Plainview, 
W. A. Turnage, Hale Center, G. 
P. Wirtz, and Jerry Turner, of 
Abernathy, W. J. Lovern, New 
Hope; B. F. Johnson, of White- 
flat, Rev, C. Ross Payne and 
Jim Burson, of Silverton, W. J. 
Teaver, of Loekney, Rev. Will­
iams, J. B. Garison, of Mata­
dor, H- 0. Conner, of Meteor, 
W P. Kays, of Cone, W. P. 
Hatchett, of Lone Star, W. W. 
Smith, Friendship, K. J. Mat­
thew, of Mt. Blanco, R. E. L. 
Muncy, of Muncy, Rev. G. I. 
Britain, G. W. Tubbs and J. J. 
Foster, ot Floydada.

They transacted considerable 
business in connection with the 
work of their church. Among 
the most important business 
transacted was 1st arranging 
for the next 5th Sunday meeting 
to meet at Whiteflat in Septem­
ber.

2nd Appropriations to several 
ot the weak churches.

3rd Elected Rev. G. I. Britain, 
W. P. Wagoner and J. W. De 
Vault as Missionaries.

4th Considered much routine 
business.

They adjourned to meet in 
Whiteflat September 28th.

The Cotton
Warehouse Plan

Bought Big Four Stock.
W. T. Brown has bought the 

Big Four Exchange stock of 
groceries, hardware, etc., a t 
Loekney, and is bringing it this 
week to Floydada with the in­
tention of closing it out. He 
and R. F. Brown were in that 
City Tuesday and Wednesday 
invoicing the stock.

Gin in Fine Shape.
With the appearance of the 

fall ginning season the Farmers’ 
Gin Company, of Floydada, have 
their gin in very fine condition, 
and ready to take care of the cot­
ton this season in t e most mod­
ern manner. Their recently in­
stalled Huller stands will accom­
modate 40 bales daily, while 
their other machinery is equally 
as good. Every condition , is 
ideal.

Their first bale was ginned 
Wednesday evening, and turned 
out a pretty sample.

We want the farmers to know 
it is no idle saying that the gin 
at Floydada, owned by farmers, 
operated by experienced gin 
men is in position to take care 
of their ginning.

All kinds of harness goods,— 
Buggy harness, Wagon harness, 
etc., also all kinds of leather re­
pairing neatly done, at Jones 
Hdw. ltc.

J. D. Farmer has accepted a 
place with the Farmers’ Gin Co., 
to operate their stands during 
the ginning season.

jftrst Mattonai Bank
F L O Y D A D A  T E X A S

Capital
Surplus

Jno. N. Farris President.
V- Presiden.,

$50,000
25,000

E. C. Nelson Cashier

Last Tuesday evening the 10th 
J. M. Armstrong, of Fort Worth 
siate organizer of the Farmers’ 
Union was in Floydada and ad­
dressed a small crowd of busi­
ness men and farmers at the 
public school auditorium,—A 
crowd not nearly commensurate 
with the importance of the sub­
ject dealt with.

The marketing of cotton was 
taken up and dealt with in a 
business-like manner, Mr. 
Armstrong making his points 
clear with forceful illustrations. 
He showed in a very logical way 
the result of a year’s supply of J 
cotton being thrown on the 
market in 3 months, and to this 
w riter’s mind gave the logical 
solution of the marketing pro­
blem,—the warehouse plan. 
Many sneakers who address 
farmers on their problems be­
gin and end their perorations by 
lambasting some other class of 
people—the merchant, the bank­
er or the lawyer, —but Mr Arm­
strong talked business through­
out. He urged the necessity of 
the banker and the business 
man, and showed the common 
point on which the farmer and 
these must co-operate to make 
cotton marketing a success.

This matter is one which push­
es itself on every man in the 
cotton growing counties, and 
quite a little agitating is being 
done toward the erection of a 
warehouse at Floydada. The 
business men and the farmer see 
that their interests are common 
and hence a common mo vement 
among them.
We expect to be able to report 
something definite next week as 
regards a warehouse at this 
place.

Mr. Armstrong spoke Wednes­
day night at Lakeview and 
speaks tonight at Loekney, Fri­
day night at Mickey.

In the Gourse of' Armstrong’s 
talk Tuesday night he made re­
ference to the farmer who cuss­
es the combines and the specula­
tor and says that - “ the farmer 
won’t stick.” He took this 
kind ot a farmer as a good ex­
ample of the very farmer that 
won’t stick, and showed him up 
in his true light The greatest 
trouble with any man in any 
line of business is the fact that 
he won’t stick, and the farmer 
has begged the other man to 
inakejnm some kind of a price 
on the product of - the labor of 
himself, and his family, that he 
is the most glaring example of 
this very -  fau lt- Thq farmer 
who asks the other man to set 
the price on his lgbor should not 
“cuss” the other man for taking 
advantage of the" chance to 
speculate a little. The farmer 
would do the same. It is true 
in every line. When any man 
puts out' an article and asks the 
other fellow to set the price, 
and on top of that dumps his 
whole product on the market at 
once he has started on the road 
to bankruptcy. Money has a 
standard value the year round, 
so has calico, as with every oth­
er manufactured article, and al­
most every raw material, except 
cotton. The fruit grower pro­
tects himself with organized 
distribution, the miner curtails 
his out put, the merchant buys 
only what he can distribute dur­
ing the season. If they don’t 
bankruptcy looms on the horiz­
on.

People, then, who have the 
marketing of the greatest staple 
on earth must protect themsel­
ves, (Farmers, bankers and 
merchants for they all have a 
hand in it) and when they do do 
this by means of perfected or-

Means Bu s i n e s s
The two reports which fol ow 

look good from a railroad point 
of view for Floydada. They are 
authentic and Q. A. & P 
people mean business, When 
any other road builds into Floy 
dada the Santa Fe is very apt to 
build on outsoutheast, so that 
this matter assumes a very in­
teresting angle.

Quanah, Sep.t. 5.—The Quan 
ah. Acme & Pacific railroad 
company let the contract today 
to the Texas ^Construction com­
pany of Fort Worth forty miles 
of road to be completed bv May 
15. Mr. Lazarus, president of 
the road, said that material was 
on the way and that some had 
arrived, and that construction 
would be pushed to get the Mot­
ley county crop moved as soon 
as possible. L E. Walker, presi­
dent of the Quanah, Seymour, 
Dublin & Rockport railroad, 
will be here this week to see 
about beginning work on this 
road, which has changed its 
name to the Central of Texas 
since it is to be financed by the 
Cowper Thwaite syndicate of 
London.
Extension of Q. & P. May be 

Carried on.
The Quanah, Acme & Pacific 

recently ordered an extension to 
be built from Paducah to the 
west border Motley county, a 
distance of forty milles. It is 
the general opinion in railroad 
circles in Fort Worth that this 
extension will be continued on 
to Floydada, where it will con­
nect with a branch of the Santa 
Fe, but this was not verified by 
Sam Lazarus, president or Char­
les H, Sommer, vice president, 
both of St. Louis, who were in 
the city for a short time Tues­
day.

Beginning last Sunday,* motor 
car service between Quanah and 
Paducah was established, the 
car making one round trip each 
day. The car has a capacity of 
ninety passengers and in addit­
ion, compartments for express 
and baggage.

Mr. Lazarus and Mr. Sommer 
passed through here in a private 
car on their way to Quanah, 
from which point they will start 
on an inspection tour of the 
road, then return to St. Louis.— 
Ft. Worth Record of Sept. 5.

Mule Stealing Scare.
Last Wednesday what appear­

ed to a some stolen mules were 
apprehended at the City Pound 
but later developments proved 
the suspicious were unfounded. 
Some 15 mules had disappeared 
from Lubbock County sometime 
since and the sheriff of that 
county had sent out descriptions 
of them over the country, one 
reaching the sheriff of this 
county. As it happened the 
sheriff of Motley county was in 
this City and had seen six mules 
which seemingly answered the 
description of the mules stolen. 
On this foundation the sheriff’s 
department held the mules sub­
ject to investigations. Mean­
while J . B. Shurbet who had 
bought the mules from Bert 
Flinchum of New Mexico, was 
out of town, and Clint Sheppard, 
of Plainview, for whom he was 
buying, was called up, as well 
as the men in Lubbock, from 
whom the 15 mules had been 
stolen, both of whom boarded 
automobiles for this city to in­
vestigate. Arriving about noon, 
the Lubbock county man ac­
companied by the sheriff of that 
county.

The mules proved to be dif­
ferent mules, but of almost ex­
actly similar brands and des­
cription, and the interested par­
ties returned home afternoon.

S. E. Duncan’s New Grocery.
Our readers doubtless read 

with interest last week S. E. 
Duncan’s announcement of his 
intention to open an up-to-date 
groceryjon south side. He re­
signs the assistant cashiership ot 
The First National Bank to go in 
business, in which he will in all 
likelihood, be successful as he 
formerly engaged in this line 
and has the benefit of his former 
experience.

New Meat Market.
Hatchell and Darrell is the 

name of a new firm who are in­
stalling an up to date Meat Mar­
ket in the Williams-Brown Gro­
cery on West side. G. M. Hatch­
ell and L. A. Darrell are proprie­
tors of the market which will 
begin selling the middle or the 
latter part of this week. Mr. 
Hatchell has moved to town and 
will have his place farmed the 
coming year.

We call attention to their ad.

Concrete W a l k
Contract Let to L. R. Wright & 

Co., at 16M cents per 
foot.

The Commissioners’ Court n 
session last Monday let the con­
tract for the laying of concre e 
walks around the courthouse 
building and lawn . In all the 
walks will amount to about II,- 
000 square feet and the contract 
price for their laying is 16>£ 
cents per square foot. The con­
tract calls for a four-foot wa<k 
around the outside of tna 
grounds and five-foot wal.^s 
leading to the four entrance . 
across the lawn, while four fo -c 
walks will be laid around ti.e 
building proper.

Some five oids were made v i 
the work and L. R. Wright <k 
Co., were the successful bidder. »

The old cour thouse was bid in 
by Tom P. Steen at $327.50, to 
be awarded when the new builu- 
ing is completed ready for oc­
cupancy.

B. F. Sanders, superintendent 
of the work, estimates that tue 
new building will be completed 
some time in the earlier part of 
November—possibly by the first 
Most of the work now occupying 
time is finish work, plastering, 
etc., and does not show nearly 
so much as before.

Buy your harness with a guar­
antee behind (hem at Jones 
Hdw. 2tc.

10-lb. bucket Cottolene, $1.35. 
2tc. O. B. Olson.

Bring me your chickens and 
buy your boy a school suit.

2te. O. B. Olson.

District Court Next Week.
On next Monday the first wet <c 

of District Court will be called 
in session by Judge L. S. Kin 
der, and the following list h a . 
been chosen by the jury com­
mission as jurors for the first 
week:

J. A. Wyman, N. T. A. Byars, 
Walter Griffith, J. W. Harmon, 
J. H. Tackett, R. W. Long, 
Judson Miller, Frank Cole, J. Vv. 
Hilliard, J. H. Fowler, J. M. 
Hamilton, John F. Fry, J, L 
Brown, L. E. McCravey, C. L*. 
Hughes, L. H. Liston, R. t , 
Covington, L. R. Nichols, D. h . 
Brown, L. H. Hart, A. J. Kin*., 
Moses W. Brown, C. D. Thack­
er, J. A. Moore.

Sewing machines at Jones 
Hdw. 2tf

Pink beans 6% per lb. Dun­
can’s. ltc.

T. S. Thagard, of Loekney, 
was in Floydada Wednesday vis­
iting his son, C. W. Thagard and 
family.

ganization there will be no such 
thing as a glutted cotton mar­
ket. The cotton will be mark­
eted when the spinners need it. 
The great work is even now 
well underway. The people of 
the south are waking up. The 
details of the plans have been 
demonstrated, the only work 
now to do to carry out these 
demonstrated facts, is to show 
the people that say “they won’t 
stick” that “they will stick,” 

The farmer and the country 
merchant, the banker and the 
doctor have gotten a tasts of 
what it means for cotton to bring 
to the producer what it is worth, 
and are studying the problem 
with wonderful success.

F ir s t  S ta te  B a n k
O F FLO Y D A D A .

Offers to its customers every accommo­
dation consistent with safe banking. 
Makes loans on acceptable collateral, ne­
gotiates real estate loans; sells exchange 
on the principal cities thru the United 
States, and foreign countries; issues time 
certificates of deposit, makes collections, 
will Care for your money, protect you from 
loss and save you from trouble.

WE INVITE YOU

to make this bank headquarters lor the 
transaction of all of your financial affairs 
assuring you ol courteous consideration 
and liberal treatment.

First State Bank
A Gurranty Fund Bank



Ia A CONTINUAL INCOME“!
Oiir New York buyer has been continually sending us new goods bring­

ing us to realize that the fall buying season is here. Our buyer Mr. Mathis 
is leaving this week for the eastern markets where he will add to our already 
well filled stock, The newest novelties in ladies and childrens ready-to- 
wear, millinery etc. Our stock is nearing completion in every department 
and we are ready to show you the goods you want to buy at the price you 
want to pay.
The Right Nomination
Ail of our custom ers have beencontinuaily nom inating the H A R T S C H A F F - 

M E R  & M A R X  C L O T H E S . A fter having been successfully installed w e ask 
your hearty  co-operation. O ur buyer w ho has for several years supported this 
line has never had  his confidence B E T R A Y E D . T h e  individuality is great. 
T H E  A L L  W O O L  PO L IC Y  W IL L  W IN  F O R  IT S  R IG H T .

Their Guarantee
You are Entitled

In  buying H a r t  Schaffner & M arx clothes to a m ost positive assurance 
yoar satisfaction.

E v ery  dealer in our clothes is authorized to  say  this to you:
E v ery  garm en t m ade by us bearing the label of H a r t  Schaffner & M arx 

guaran teed  to be all wool or wool and silk fabrics w ith  no m ercirized or cotton 
added; to  be thoroughly  shrunk before cutting; seam s sew ed w ith  pure silk 
thread; tailored in clean san itary  shops; to be free from every defect of m aterial 
and w orkm anship. M ore th an  that: T h e  dealer is authorized to say th a t if 
the clothes are not right, or not satisfactory, your m oney will be refunded.

of

is

Any Day next Week
Our shoe line is now complete.
Ladies shoes, Mens shoes

!

Boy’s shoes Girls shoes
Childrens shoes, a full line of every­
thing.

Beginning next M onday the 9th w e will give w ith  the purchase fo every  pair 
of B uster B row n shoes, boys or girls, one pair o f 25c hose. F o r boys the wild 
boy hose for the girls the P rotectoe hose. F o r One w eek only F o r cash. W e  
get the  advertisem ent you get th e  benefit o f the  avertisem en t.. Shoes Sell a t 
R egu lar price.

I

j Mathis-Martin Dry Goods Company
|& |  ' “The Store With the Goods.” |

Horse Plague is Still Spreading.
Topeka, Kans. Sept. 7—Live­

stock commissioner Mercer says 
today that the horse plague is 
still spreading, and is now pre­
valent in thirty-two counties not 
previously reported east of Man- 
nattan. In counties where the 
disease had been previously re­
ported the condition remains un­
changed except in two counties 
where the plague was the worst 
which show relief following the 
rigid feeding and watering rules 
laid down by the commissioners 
office. Following a conference 
today at the governors office re­
quest was sent to Washington 
for their best pathologist to be 
sent here at once.

High quality an 
at Charlie Jones

y and L 
íes Hard

Low prices 
ardWare. ltc*

Unlike many other studios in 
small cities the Wilson Studio 
has the artistic “ know hbw” as 
well as the material to produce 
the finest work. A visit to this 
neat well-lighted studio will 
convince. 2tc.

Public Recital.
Last Saturday evening Misses 

Barrow and Young, teachers of 
music and expression, respec­
tively at the Presbyterian Aca­
demy, gave a very creditable 
recital at the Public school audi­
torium and their program was 
received with applause by a 
fairly large crowd. The musi­
cal and oratorical departments 
of the Academy will certainly be 
up to a high standard.

The Transcript Abstract Com­
pany is fully prepared to do 
your abstracting either on town 
lots or lands anywhere in Floyd 
■County. We give proofread 
-copies of all instruments, and 
will appreciate any business in­
trusted to us. ftf

Sheriff’s Sale.
STATE OF TEXAS, )
County of Floyd j By Virtue.
of an Alias Execution issued out 
of the Honorable County Court 
of Floyd County, on the 29th. 
day of August 1912 by the Clerk 
thereof, in the case of D. Heffle- 
finger versus A. L. Stovall No. 
139, and to me. as Sheriff, dir­
ected and debvered, I will pro­
ceed to sell, within the hours 
prescribed by law for Sheriff’s 
Sales, on the first Tuesday in 
October A D. 1912, it being the 
1st day of said month, before 
the Court House door of said 
Floyd County. T h ^ h e  town of 
Floydada, the f£>llowipg describ­
ed property, tjb-wit: ^

The West one half of Section 
No. 44, Abstract No. 1946, Certi­
ficate No. 1229, Original grantee 
S. L. Rushing, Located about 8 
miles East of Floydada Texas in 
Block No. 1, A. B. & M. Contain­
ing 320 Acres Levied on as the 
property of A. L. Stovall to 
satisfiy a Judgement amounting 
to $302.31 in favor of D. Heffle- 
finger and cost of suit."

Given under my hand, this 
29th day of August 1912.

A. C. ¿Goen Sheriff.

Plain view Nursery.
Will trade gpdd ntwsery stock 

for peach seetjl and second hand 
sacks. We ar$ better equipped 
and have better stock than ever 
before. Come to see us.

Plainview Nursery. 
Plainview, Texas. 4tc.

Tarver Bests Frank Beverly.
Clrivis, N. M., Aug. 29.—Cass 

Tarver, the big “ white hope” 
giant of Anson, Texas, knocked 
out-Frank Beverly of Dallas,

Finds Books Straight.
Auditor Payne of the Wells 

Fargo Express Co., was here 
several days last week looking 
into the records of former ex-

here tonigffTn the eighth round,; press agent Wright, who had 
clearly demonstrating his super- * disappeared mysteriously. Mr.
iority and his qualifications to 
star in last company in future.

The battle was Tarver’s from 
the sound of the gong, although 
Beverly fought viciously and 
and stood punishment gamely.

The fight was witnessed by 
hundreds of ring fans who came 
to Clovis from distant and near­
by points. Many have been 
here for the past week, but the 
-number was greatly augmented 
yesterday and today.

The ringside was crowded and 
the fansevidencedtheir approval 
in the usual lusty-lunged fashion 
throughout the contest.

Tarver looks like Big Business 
from this time on.

Twine a t Jones Hdw. 2tc.

Making Preporatkms.
In a recent letter to W. M. 

Massie & Bro., A. E. Barkemeyer, 
of S^gwick, Kan., stated that 
heismaking preparation,tp come 
to F-i <ada at the earliest pos­
sible v to begin work on the 
new fii oof elevator and ware 
house.

Organize Light Company.
Tuesday afternoon the Lock- 

ney Light and Power Company 
was organized with a capital 
stock of $3,000. The plant has 
been purchased from D. A. For- 
bus, and will be operated by the j 
new company. The officers elec­
ted are as follows:

E. P. Thompson, President; 
Wm. McGehee, Vice-President; 
D. C. Lowe, Treasurer; J. C. 
Garrison, Secretary. Following 
are the directors:

D. C. Lowe, E. P. Thompson, 
Wm. McGehee, J. C. Garrison 
and S. A. Henry.—Lockney Bea­
con.

Payne attended to the office 
duties and drove around the ex­
press wagon until the arrival 
of the newly appointed agent L. 
O. Kirk from Higgins. It was 
sometime before the safe was 
opened and when it was and 
books checked up it was found 
that Wright was not in the red 
with the company and also a 
letter of confession. The sub­
stance of the letter was that 
Wright deplored the fact of 
leaving the company without 
an agent, that he had taken 
strychnine and wood alcohol 
and only made him a little sick; 
that secret service men were 
watching him, etc.

The last heard of Wright was 
at Portales, N. M. As his re­
cord seems to have been found 
straight with the company he is 
not sought by them.—Hereford 
Recorder.

No. 7045
Report of the condition of

The First National Bank
at Floydada, in the state of Texas, at the 
close of business, Sept. 4, 1912.

RESOURCES
Loans and discounts - $129,182.27
Overdrafts, secured and unsec. 429.18 
U.S. Bonds to secure circula’n 12,500.00 
Premiums on U. S. Bonds - 462.22
Banking house, Furn. and Fix. 28,598.20 
Other Real Estate owned 1,003.00
Due from National Banks,

not reserve agents 
Cash Collection acct.
Due from Approved Res. Agts.
Checks and other cash items 
Notes «f other National Banks 
Fractional paper currency, 

nickels and cents,
L awful Money Reserve in Bank, viz: 

Specie B,1059.75 8,059.75
Redemption fund yvith U. S. Treas­

urer, 5 per tent of Circ. 625.00 
Due from U. 5. Treasurer, 600.00

Total - $208,303.24

194.44
96.61 

22,919.99
681.97

2,919.00

31.61

To Attend Normal.
Among those who left Monday 

Morning for Canyon to attend 
the normal school were: Misses 
Jessie Green, Ethel Trowbridge, 
Sallie Brown; Messrs, Price 
Scott, Olin 8. Miller.

Likes Tulia.
J. R. Brown, one of Floydada’s 

men, was in Tulia the first of the 
week. Mr. Brown made a trip 
out to Vigo and covered the 
greatest part of the eastern half 
of the county and reports crops 
much better around Floydada 
and Lockney. He expressed 
himself as being well pleased 
with the Tulia country and said 
Tulia was a much larger place 
than he expected to find. Mr. 
Brown left Wednesday for Ama­
rillo where he will visit for a few 
days before returning to his 
home. —Tulia Herald.

The best harness in town for 
less mone^ at Jones Hdw. 2tc.

LIABILITIES
Capital stock paid in -  $50,000.00
Surplus fund . . .  10,000.00
Undivided profits, less expen­

ses end taxes paid - 18,088.30
National Bank notes outst’g 12,500.00 
Due to State and Private

Banks and Bankers 2,123.40 
Individual Deposits sub. to chk 83,071.43 
Time certificates of deposit 5,470.11
Bills payable, including certificates of 

deposit for money borrow 15,000.00 
Contribution by Stock holders 12,000.00 
Liabilities other than those

above stated 50.00

Official Statement Of The Financial Con­
dition Of the

FIRST STATE BANK
at Floydada Slate of Texas, at the close 
of business on the 4th day of Sept. 1912 
published in the Floyd Co. Hesperian, a 
newspaper printed and published at 
Floydada, State of Texas, on the 12 
day of Sept. 191-2.

RESOURCES
Loans and Discounts, personal

or collateral $67,450.34 
Loan, real estate. 14,717.47
Overdrafts. 538.20
Suspense 90.35
Real Estate, banking house. 8,792.99 
Other Real Estate. 3,000.00
Furniture and Fixtures. 2,286.65
Due from Approved 
Reserve Agent, net 24,611.31 
Due from other BJk%. and Banker, 
Sub.tocheck.net 2,123.40 26,734.7!
Cash Items 
Currency 

Specie

555.8^ 
3,592.00 
1,435.$7 

Interest in Depositors 
Guaranty Fund 
Other Resources as follow: 
Collection Account 
Asst. G. Fund
Total

5,583.54

1.420.0S

140.00
72.00

130,826.30

Total - $208,303.24
State of Texas, County of Floyd, ss:

I, E. C. Nelson, Cashier of the above 
named bank, do solemnly swear that the 
above statement is true to the best of my 
knowledge and belief.

E. C. Nelson,Cashier 
Subscribed and sworn to before me this 

11th day of Sept., 1912.
Homer Steen 

Notary Public 
Floydada, Texas.

CORRECT—Attest:
R. C. Andrews

C. Surginer „
John N. Farris

Directors

LIABILITIES
Capital Stock paid in 30,000.00
Surplus Fund 2,640.00
Undivided Profits, net 270.25
Due to Bk’s and Bankers, 

subject to checks, net 3 1.04
Individual Deposits
subject to check 69,690.03
Time Certificates of Deposit 12,710.21 
Cashier’s Check 464.77
Bills Payable and Rediscounts 15,000.00 
Other Liabilities as follow:
Letter of Credit 20.00
Total 130,826.30
State Of Texas County of Floyd. We, 
W. A. Robbins as V-President, and Jas. 
K. Green as cashier of said bank, each 
of us do solemnly swear that the above 
statement is true to the best of our 
knowledge and belief.

W. A. Robbins V-President, 
Jas. K, Green, Cashier. 

Sworn and subscrided to before me this 
11 day of Sept., A. D. nineteen hundred 
and twelve. Witness my hand 
rial seal on the dat <; last i 

T. F, Houghton T 
CORRECT-ATTEST:

S. L. Rush’
L, H



ORDER ESTABLISHING 
ELECTION PRECINCTS.

T H E  STATE OF TEXAS,
Countv of Floyd,

IN TH E COUNTY COM­
M ISSIONER’S COURT of 
Floyd County, Texas.*

August Term A. D. 1912.
On this loth day of August A.

D 1912 the Commissioner’s 
Court of said County, at a regu­
lar quarterly term thereof, con­
vened for the purpose of trans­
acting such business as is re­
quired by law to be disposed of 
at this term. All members of 
the Court being prseent, the 
Honorable F. P. Henry County 
Judge presiding, when among 
others fhe following proceed­
ings were had, to-wit :

And now, on this day the 
Court proceeded to divide the 
said County into convenient 
Electon Precincts ; and it ap­
pearing to the Court that their 
said County had heretofore 
been divided into proper Jus­
tices’ Precincts, remaining fixed 
at this date, and the Court hav­
ing duly considered the bound­
aries of said Justice’s Precincts | miles 
as well as the law* governing- 
such divsions:

It is therefore hereby ordered 
by thé County Commissioners’
Court that the County of Foyd 
Texas be and the same is here­
by divided into 15 Election Pre­
cincts, to be numbered consecu­
tively, and that the number and

easterly direction with creek, in 
Blanco Canyon, to a point in 
East line of Section 25 J. V. 
Massie; Thence North with east 
line of said Section 25 to its 
North East Corner; Thence 
west on .North line of said Sec­
tion 25 to the South East corner 
of the J. W. King Survey; 
Thence North about one and 
one half miles to the North east 
corner of the W. S. Adams Sur­
vey ; Thence east about one mile 
to the South east corner of the 
L. C, Garrison, Survey; Thence 
north on Section lines nine miles 
to the North east Corner of Sec­
tion 37, the place of beginning 
and elections in said precinct 
shall be held at Floydada.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 2

(Starkey.)
Beginning at a point in the 

East line of section 25. J. V. 
Massey at creek in Blanco Can­
yon; Thence in a meandering 
North Westerly direction with 
creek to the north east corner 
of section 16 Block G .; Thence 
West on Section lines two 

Thence South on Sec­
tion lines about seven or 
eight miles to the South line 
of the County; Thence East 
about nine miles on South line 
of Floyd County; to East line 
of Section 26, B. &B. Blk. 2; 
Thence North on section lines 
about two miles to creek in Blan 
co Canyon, the place of begin-

han county School Land to the 
S.W. corner of the W.Methly 80 
acre Homestead Survey Thence 
East to South-East corner of 
same; Thence North to the 
North-west corner of the M. M. 
Day 160 acre Homestead Sur­
vey; Thence East about 11-2  
miles to the South west corner 
of section 57, block G; Thence 
East 7 miles to the South east 
corner of section 79, block G; 
Thence North about 2 1-4 
miles to North W est corner 
of the S. M. Brown, Homestead 
Survey; Thence East about 3 
1-2 miles to the South east cor­
ner of Section 83, Block D 3; 
Thence North with Secton lines 
about 9 miles to the North- east 
corner of section 32, Block Dl, 
The place of beginning.

And the Eelection in said Pre­
cinct shall be held at Lockney, 
Texas.

the boundaries of each of saiduiing.
Election precincts so establish- \ And the Election in said Fre­
ed shall be and are as follows, I cinct shall be held at Starkey 
to-w it: [ School House.

ELECTION PRECINCT i ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 1. \ No. 3

(Floydada Box) * (Lockney.) -.
Beginning at the North East? Begnning at the North east 

Corner of Section No. 37 Block corner of section. 32 Block D 1; 
1, A. B. &‘M .; Thence West on Thence vvestyM^ectKii lines ten 
Survey lines 4 miles to East line miles to thqr Norm West corner 
of Section 88, Block G .; Thence of Section M  Blk. D 2; Thence 
North on survey lines two miles South one jnile to the North 
to North East Cprner of Sur- West corner of Section 51. same 
vey 82, same
west on Survey lines three miles 
to the North-west Corner of 
Section 52 ; same Block; Thence 
South on Secton lines four miles 
to North line of Sur. designated

Block; Thence Block; ThYice wear two miles 
on section mre-s-Mo the N. W. 
corner of Section 63, Block 
D 2; Thence due South on Sec­
ton lines about Seven miles to 
the N. E. Corner of the O. L. 

on map as G. C. & S. F. Ry. Co.' Beall Survey; Thence West on 
S. 11861 ; Thence West to North/ Survey line about 3 1-2 miles to 
Yv est Corner of /said Secton ; the west boundarv line of Floyd
Thence South on Section lines 
two miles to the North-West 
corner of Secton 21, Block P .; 
Thence West one mile on Sec­
tion lines to North West Corner 
of Section 22, Block G; Thence 
South on Section lines Two 
miles to South-west Corner of 
Survey. designated on map as G. 
C. S. D. & R. G. N. G. Co. S.

County ¡Thence south with west 
boundary line of Floyd County,' 
about 3 miles to the north line 
of League No. 2, Calahan Coun­
ty School land Thence east with 
the North lines of Leagues Nos. 
2 and 1, Callahan County School 
land to the North east corner 
of League Number one said 
Callahan Countv School Land;

11247 to creek in Canyon. 'Thence South wth East line of 
Thence meandering in a South- said League No. I.,.óf said Calla-

Rules of Piano Contest.
1. There will be given one Capital Prize consisting of a piano to 
the person obtaining the largest amount of cash certificates or 
votes; contest begins-June 24, 1912 and closes Nov. 27, 1912 at 4 
P. M.
2. Any white person, regardless of age or sex, living in this sec­
tion will be eligible as a contesta nt, and those who enter and-take 
partin the contest thereby bind themselves to abide by these rules.
3. Any person may nominate as many contestants as he or she 
may desire either on coupons found in The Hesperian, on other 
blanks furnished b.y us or by sending in or bringing in to us the 
name of the party whom it is desired to nominate; or in the same 
manner, any Person, may nominate him or herself. The Hesperian 
reserves the right to reject any nomination or to change the plan, 
or make any addition thereto it may deem necessary,
4. Each candidate may obtain one 1000 vote certificate free. On­
ly one of such 1000 vote certificate will be counted for the same 
person.
5. Official ballots clipped from The Hesperian may be voted be­
fore the time stated thereon.
6. Certificates will be issued by The Hesperian for new and old 
subscriptions, old accounts, job printing and advertising. On 
new subscriptions to the Hesperian of $1, 1200 votes; if old 800 
vdtes; oif old accounts 800 votes; on advertising and job printing 
800 votes for each dollar paid. Certificates must be called for 
when cash is paid to us.
7. Certificates shall be cast in ballot box at the office of The Hes­
perian.
8. Certificates cannpt be transferred or withdrawn after being
deposited. {
9. The certificates or votes shall be counted by a disinterested 
party and the relative standing of the contestants will be announ­
ced from time to time. Three disinterested judges will make the 
final count.
10. In case of a tie vote, the value of the prize will be equally di­
vided among those polling a tie vote.
11. No employee of this paper nor any one connected with it will 
be permitted to enter the contest.
12. Issues of The Hesperian will not be sold in quantities for the 
official ballots contained therein.
13. AcashcommL ' of 20 cents will be paid on all cash sub­
scriptions to  ̂ tant who steadily works through the en­
tire bs not win the Capital prize nor any minor
priz

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 4 

(Cedar)
Begning at a point in the East 

line of Floyd County and in the 
North line of section 9 block 
GM.; Thence west w ith section 
lines about 14 1-2 miles to the 
North west corner of secton 19, 
Block D5.; Thence South with 
Section lines 6 miles to the 
South west corner of section 81, 
Block D 3; Thence east on Sec­
tion 1/ines 6 miles to the South­
east corner of Section 77 'Thence 
South with Section line one mile 
to the South west corner of Sec­
tion 91, Block D 3; Thence East 
with Section lines about 9 1 
miles to East line of Floyd 
County; Thence North with 
east line of- Floyd County, about 
7 miles t o place of 1> eginuing.

And elections in said precinct 
shall be held at Cedar School 
House.

corner of section 15; Thence 
North on Section lines to 
the North West Corner of 
Section 22; Thence East to the 
N orth-east corner of same; 
Thence North with section lines 
about 6 miles to the place of 
beginning tow it; the N. E. Cor. 
Section 51. and Elections shall 
be held at Sand Hill School 
House.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 8.

(Lakeview)
Beginning at the North east 

corner of Section 3. A. B. & M. 
Thence west with section lines 
7 mies to the North west corner 
of Section 7, Blk. 1; Thence S. 
Two miles to the South west 
corner of Section 34; Thence 
W. 1 mile to the north west cor­
ner C. A. Nilson, Homestead 
Survey; Thence South with sur­
veys to the North line of Section 
25; Thence East to the Corner 
of same. Thence South about 
2 1-2 miles to S. line of Floyd 
County; Thence East along 
South line of Floyd County to 
the East line of Section 21; 
Thence North to the North east 
Corner of same ; Thence East to 
South east corner of Eddy 
Sparks, Survey; Thence North 
to the North east corner of same 
Thence West about 1-2 mile; 
Thence north one mile to south
line of section 17; Thence East 
H E S P E R IA N  T H R E E  T H R E E ' 3 3 3
to the South east corner of said 
Section 17; Thence North two 
miles to the North East corner 
of secton 1, the place of begin­
ning.

Election shall be held at Lake 
view School House.

line of Floyd County; Thence 
East with South line of said 
Floyd County to the South-East 
Corner of said County; Thence 
North with East line of Said 
Floyd County about 8 miles to 
the place of beginning.

And Elections in said Pre­
cinct shall be held at Antelope 
School House.

Star School House.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 5

(Fairmount)
Begining at the North east 

corner of Floyd County; Thence 
west on north line of Floyd 
County about 6 1-2 miles to east 
line of section 102; Block 4; 
Thence South on Section lines 
about 9 2-3 miles to the S. W. 
Cor. of Section 20, Block G. M. 
Thence East about 6 1-2 miles 
to the East line of Floyd Coun­
ty ; Thence North with East line 
of said County, about 1.0 miles 
to the North east cor. of Floyd 
County, the place of beginning.

Election shall be held at Fair- 
mount School House in said 
Precinct.^r

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 6 

(Baker)
Beginning at a point in east 

line of Pkwd County, at East 
line of Section designated as 
Cert. No. 4-578; Thence West 
with Section lines 14 miles to 
North West Corner of Section 
38, Block 1. Thence South with 
SectOn lines 7 miles to the South 
west corner of section 126 same 
Block ; Thence east about 9 1-3 
mife^on section lines to West 
line of Eastland Co. School land 
't hence North on west line of 
said" Eastland County School 
land to the North East corner of 
said.school land ; Thence, east on 
north line of said Eastland coun­
ty school land to the North east 
Corner of same; Thence north 
to the North W est .Cornier of 
Section 6. Block 3 ; Thence-East 
on section lines to east line of 
Floyd County; Thence North 
with east line of Fl^yd Cbuitty 
to place of beginning, and-Elec­
tions shall be held at the Baker 
School House.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 7

(Sand Hill)
Begining at the North east 

corner of Section 51; Block G; 
Thence West with Survey lines 
to the South west Corner of the 
W. Methley Homestead Sur­
vey; Thence North with East 
line of League No. 1, Callahan 
County School and to the North 
east corner of same;.Thence \V 
on North line of Leagues Nos. 1 
and 2, to the west line of Floyd 
County; Thence South with the 
AYest line of Floyd County, to 
the South line of Section 6. blk. 
Tv; Thence East with section 
fines about 4 miles, to AYest line 
of Section 5 Blk. FI; Thence 
South to the South-west corner 
of said Secton 5; Thence e ~"L

ELECTXON PRECINCT 
No. 9 

(Sun Set.)
Beginning at a point in the 

East line of Section H)J. Block 
B 5 ; on the North line of Floyd 
Qpunty, Texas, Thence AYest 
with north line of Floyd county 
to the West line of Section 2, 
Block B 5 ; Thence South with 
Section lines about 9 1-2 miles, 
to the South west Corner of 
Section 20 Block D l; Thence 
East 8 miles to the South East 
Corner of Secton 21, Block GM. 
Thence North with Section lines 
about 9 2-3 miles to the North 
Boundary line of Floyd County, 
Texas, the place of beginning. 
And said election sha! he he < 
at Sun Set School House.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 12 

(Allmon)
Beginning at the North East 

Corner of Section No. 3 ; Block 
H ; Thence AYest to the East 
line of Section 10, Block K; 
Thence North to the North east 
Corner of said Section No. 10; 
Thence AYest about 4 miles to 
the W est line of Floyd County, 
Texas, Thence South with AYest 
line of Floyd County to the S W 
Corner of said County ; Thence 
East with South line of said 
County, to a point due South of 
the South east corner of Section 
41, Block K : Thence North on 
Survey lines to the North east 
Corner of Section 3, the place of 
beginning.

And Election in said Precinct 
shall be held at Allmon School 
House.

Done by order of Comm 
sioners’ Court.

W. B. CLARK, 
County Cle;

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 10

(Center)
Beginning at a point in East 

Boundary line of Floyd County 
Texas at a point in south line 
of Section 17: Thence AYest to 
East line of Survey S. F. 432; 
Thence South to a point due 
East of the South east corner 
of Section 256 block D 3; Thence 
due West about 9 mles on Sec­
tion .lines-to the North East cor­
ner of Section 107; Thence N 
one mile to the North East cor­
ner of Section 90; Thence AYest 
about 8 2-3 'miles to East line 
of Section 65 ; Block C .; Thence 
South about 4 1-4 miles to the 
South west corner of section 
33 ¡Thence due east about 18 1-4 
miles to the East line of Floyd 
County,. Texas ; Thence North 
with East line of Floyd County; 
about 3 3-5 miles to place of be­
ginning. And Election in said 
Precinct shall be held at Center 
Schoo lHouse. * I

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 11 

(Antelope)
Beginning at a point on East 

Boundary line of Floyd County 
Texas in the North line of Sec- 
11, Block 1; Thence west to 
East line of section 5 block 1; 
Thence South to the South-east 
corner of same section; Thence 
West to the North-West Cor­
ner of the Eastland County 
School land; Thence South to 
the South east corner of J. H. 
Johnson survey; Thence west to 
the North AYest Corner Section 
136, Block 1 : Thence South two 
miles to the South east corner 

| of secton 17; Thence AYest on 
South line of said Section 17 ;

I Thence south to the North line 
1 of Eddy Sparks Survey'; Thence 
East to the North East corner 
of said Eddy Sparks Survey; 
Thence South' to the ;S
h corner of 
c.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 13 

(Meteor)
Begnning at the North East 

Corner of Section No. 64 Block 
D 2; Thence AA'est with section 
lines to the W est line of Floyd 
County, about 3 1-2 miles;
Thence South with the west line 
of said County, about 7 miles to 
a point in the North line of sec­
tion 16, Block N; Thence East 
about 3 1-2 miles to the North 
East Corner of O. AY. Beall, 
Homestead Survey; Thence N. 
about 6 2-3 miles to the North 
East corner of section 64, the 
place of beginning.

And Elections in said Precinct 
shall be held at the Meteor 
School Hohse.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 14 

(Providence)
Beginning at a point in North 

boundary line of Floyd County 
in the West line of Section 31; 
Thence west along the North 
line of Floyd County to the 
North-West Corner of said 
County ; Thence South with AY 
line of said Floyd County about 
7 2-3 miles to a point in the 
South line of Section 70. Block 
D2; Thence East on Section 
lines about 5 2-3 miles to the 
South East Corner of Section 
63; same Block; Thence North 
on Section lines about 7 2-3 
miles to the place of beginning.

And Elections in said Pre­
cincts shall be held at Provi­
dence School House.

Arthur B. Dunes
General Land Agen

F loyd ad a , T exas.
W ill B u y . Sell unci L ea  
L ea l E s ta te  on C om m is  
sion; R e n d er  a n d  P a y  

Ta x e s  fo r  N o n -R e sid en t  
F u rn ish  A b stra c ts;  

in v e s tig a te  a n d  Perfi 
Titles.

Have h a d  2 0  Year's 
E xperience w ith  Floy 

C ounty  La,nds.
A o n -R esid en t L a n d s  a 

Specia lty
Office on Southeast CornerJ

Public Square
___ r

JlA ep
T. M. COX, Pro;
All barber w ork first clas 
All trea tm en t courteous. 
Shallow W ater Steam 
L aundry  represented.
Hot or cold baths. Ni< 
clean tubs,

W. M. Massie &
General Land Agents

( t h e  S E N I O R  L A N D  5 A B S T R A C T  B U S H  

F L O Y D  C O . )

B u y , S e l l , Le a s e , o r  E xo h ai

L a n d
in any size tracts through Northwes 
as especially throagh Floyd and 
Counties of the beautiful Plains; 
der and Pay Taxes, Furnish Abs 

Perfect Tities & Lk.
NON RESIDENT LANt 

A SPECIALTY
A ddress

W. M. Massie & B
Floydada Texas

T. R  H oughton Claude V

Houghton & Hall 
A ttorneys a t L aw

Flondada Tc

/

V

J. H . B R O W N L F
L aw y er

First National Ban! 
ing

Telephone No. 11.

ELECTION PRECINCT 
No. 15 

(Lone Star.)
Beginning at a point in the 

North line of Floyd County in 
the- East line of section 4; block 
B4; Thence west on the north 
line of Floyd county about 10 
miles to the west line of section 
31, Block B 4, Thence South on 
Secton lines about 6 2-3 miles to 
the South AYest Corner of Sec­
tion 85, Block C 9 ; Thence East 
on Secton lines 10 miles to the 
South East Corner of Section 29 
Block D 1; Thence North on 
section linws about 6 2-3 miles 
to place of begnning.

And Electioiis in said Pre­
cinct shall be held at the Lone

/  v
D rs. Childers & A ndrew s

Phyéicians and Surge»
Flo) dada, i exas.

Office on Southwest Cor. Sc 
Professional Calls Attendi 

Day, or Night.

_____ _

s
I DRS. S M IT H  & SM I

Physicians and Surgeo.
Office at Goins Pharmacy 

Day phone 51 
I Night phone 16
\ ___ _ _ _____ ____________ y

W h y  w o rry  ab ou t  

th e h o t w eath er?

T ry  our fountain and 
quench your thirst, and for­
get about the long hot days 
O ur drinks are delicious, 
and our fountain is scrupu­
lously clean.

FW^ada Dn

r\A



T H E  F L O Y D  C O U N T Y

HESPERIAN
Published every Thursday* by 

T h e  H esperian  Pub. Co.

Homer Steen, Ed—Mg?\

Entered as second-class matter April 20 
1907, at the post office at Floydada, Te$as 
under the act of Congress of March 3 
1879.

Subscription.
One copy one year, in advance 51.00 
)ne copy six months, in advance .50

Advertising Rates. :
display ads 50c per inch, per iponth. 4 

weeks.»
Display ads I5c per inch, single issue.
Local Readers 10c per line for first inser­

tion, 5c per line for each subse­
quent insertion. 

ront page, double price.
When time is not specified all advertis- 

matter will be run until ordered ou 
arged for accordingly.

SANTA FE TIME TABLE.

West Bound 
Train No. 802 

Leaves 
9:00 a. m.

East Bound 
Train No. 801 

Arrives 
5: p. m.

Nominees.
Of the Democratic Party sub­

ject to the General Election in 
November:
Rates;
District officers: $15 

ounty offices: $10 
'ecinct offices: $5

For District Attorney. 
Geo. L. Mayfield.

For Sheriff & Tax Collector, 
v. C. Goen.

For County & District Clerk. 
V, B. Clark.

For Tax Assessor.
B. C. Willis.

'or Com. Pre. No. 4. 
as. Trowbridge.

l'or County Treasurer. 
W. Thagard.

For County Judge, 
i. B. Duncan.

r Com. Pre. No. 1. 
Howard.

* Com. Pre. No. 3. 
L. Ormon.

For Justice of the Peace, Pre 
No. 1.

J. D. Price.

^or County Surveyor, 
A. Lider.

For County Attorney.
B. Bartley-

Idle Reflections.
lay, the spring that “ savage” 
ke on Savage regular as clock 

ork. Get you a brick Savage, 
for the next Man that tries to 
take your name in vain,

Nelson is like a fish in water— 
right at home making a school 
alk.

They all orate about visiting 
ne school. That’s like Mark 
fwain’s eligson—Easy to preach, 
hard to practice.

“ That was a dag gone good 
article on the county Fair. Reck­
on “ they “are going to Have it?” 
I reckon “they” will—nit.

Shearer had some of his chur­
ch members dodging Monday 

ning. He said something
about establishing, an industrial 
department as a part of the 
public school system, and they 
thought h ~ oroing to, take up 

bec^

Never saw conditions better.
Skin’em.— Here’s your bill, 

Mr. Easy Mark!
Easy Mark— (Falling by the 

wayside) Excuse me!

“ All productive work in social 
service,” such is the slogan of 
Mr. O. J. Kern of Illinois, who 
was the most notable speaker 
before the educators gathered 
to observe Rural Education 
Week at the University of Tex­
as in July. That is what he 
tells his teachers starting out 
into the county to their little 
one-room schools. “All produc- 
tive work is social service, and 
the best service the average per­
son can render the community 
is, to do bis regular work well. 
The first service a teacher can 
offer is to teach the beso school 
that was ever taugh in that 
whole neighborhood. Teach 
arithmetic for example, well— 
better than it was ever taught 
there before. And then on the 
side get a boy or two interested 
in better corn, or better beef, 
and just that much more good is 
accomplished. For the first 
service of a school is to fit its 
pupils for productive work.”

The Hesperian can hardly see 
the matter in exactly that light 
but we are constrained to be­
lieve that the reason for the 
inactivity of the business men 
of the town on the question of a 
county fair is the result ot rea­
soning to the effect that an ex­
penditure of $700 or $800, the 
necessary amount for the proper 
carrying out of the fair, is  ̂an 
expense which is not warranted 
by the direct or indirect bene­
ficial results of the same. How­
ever, this may be for the imme­
diate present we are under the 
impression that tor the future of 
our town a county fair is the 
one best annual expenditure 
that can be made. Possibly 
this year a county fair at Floy- 
dada would hardly be worth 
$800 to Floydada in cash—possi­
bly not. However, to the coun­
ty a fair would be worth that 
amount of money in increased 
incentive to greater crop pro­
duction alone,—and the other 
returns would make our expendi­
ture a valuable one without a 
doubt.

This is not the view to take 
of the matter, though, for we 
are building for the future-* 
not any more for next year— 
not as much—as for 25 years 
hence. Why? Simply because 
of the cumulative effect of, en­
deavor and progress. . We are 
now determining what Floydada 
shall be 25 years hence. Be­
cause we cannot see this our 
reasoning is oft-times wrong. 
Not saying, however, that the 
business men of Floydada have 
bad foresight. Some men in. 
this town have better foresights 
than this writer’s hindsights.

Iridium A Rare Metal.
The smooth writing qualities 

possessed by gold fountain pens 
may be attributed to the tiny 
bit of white metal—iridium - 
fastened to the tip of the pen. 
Iridium is an .exceedingly fare 
metal, according to the United 
States Geological Survey, not 
more than 5,000 ounces being 
produced each year, of which 
perhaps about 500 ounces are 
recovered in the-United States, 
mostly from imported platinum 
sand and from copper ores and 
bullion. The price demanded 
for iridium has been increasing 
rapidly, and in 1911 it ranged 
from $60 to $64 an ounce for 
pure metal.

Owing to its unique qualities, 
iridium rinds a fairly extensive 
use. Most of the metal produc­
ed is probably used for ■ harden­
ing platinum. It is further us­
ed for various scientific and tech­
nical purposes, such as -standard 
weights +s 'o^^ct noints.

ing chinaware.
According to the Bureau of 

Statistics, 3,905 troy ounces oi- 
“ iridium and iridium in nat m 
combination with platinum f^ev 
tals,” valued at -1210,616, were 
imported into the United States 
in 1911.—G. S. Bulletin.

As it is with anything else on­
ly more so, you want the best. 
You cannot afford to use inferior- 
drugs. All of our DRUGS are 
absolutely pure, we keep noth­
ing but the best. You take no 
chances when you get your med­
icine from
W H I T E  D R U G  C O .

Committee Says Count was With­
out Fraud.

Quite a little interest has been 
evinced in Floyd County in the 
contest R. M. Ellerd announced 
would be made in the district 
attorney’s race in the primaries 
between himself and Geo. L. 
Mayfield, both of Plainview in 
which Mr. Mayfield was declared 
elected. The Plainview News 
reports the committee hearing 
and other matters bearing on 
the subject as follows:

Rueben M. Ellerd last week 
filed with the democratic com­
mittee a contest of the nomina­
tion for district attorney, against 
Geo. L. Mayfield, his successful 
opponent in the recent primary.

Ellerd, in nis petition, alleges 
that he would have been elected 
had there been a fair count but 
that the counting officers at the 
Plainview, Hale Center, Runn- 
ingwater, Abernathy and Barton 
site boxes in Hale County, at all 
the boxes in Floyd,Bailey, Cas­
tro and Swisher county counted 
votes cast for him for Mayfield, 
there being more than 543 votes 
sa  fraudulently counted in the 
wjjple district.

In the July primary Mayfield 
carried every county—the vote 
being according to returns 1692 
votes for MayfieTS and 1149 votes 
for Ellerd..

The district committee, with 
Y. W. Holmes, chairman, J. N. 
"Stalbird of Floyd and Dennis 
Zimmerman of Swisher, met 
Wednesday and heard the con­
test. After hearing several wit­
nesses the committee overruled 
Ellerd’s contentions, its findings 
being as-follows: “The commit­
tee having heard and considered 
the contestee’s exceptions to con­
te s ta n ts  .pleadings, is of the 
opinion that same ought to be, 
and same are hereby, overruled. 
And the committee having pro­
ceeded to hear and consider the 
evidence adduced touching the 
Plainview election box, there be­
ing no evidence offered touching 
any other box in any county in 
the said district, is of the opinion 
that the said evidence failed to 
show that there was probably 
fraud or illigaiity in counting the 
votes; Wherefore,: the committee 
finds against the contestant, 
refuses to recount the ballots, 
and declares the contestee to be 
the legal nominee for said office; 
to which finding on the facts con­
testant then and there excepted 
and gave notice of appeal to the 
honorable district court of Hale 
County, Texas.”

In the hearing Ellerd pro­
posed, it is stated, that if the 
committee would go to each bal­
lot box and count the votes, he 
would pay all expenses and pay 
Mayfield $500, if he (Ellerd) was 
not found to be the nominee.

G. M. Britain and children, 
who hflvpabeen visiting their

G. I.

Sheep Raising Profitable.
Editor Hesperian,
Dear Sir: It may be of some 

interest to you and your readers 
for me to give you my experi­
ence and some data relating to 
sheep raising on a small scale.

Will say that on the 10th day 
of August 1910,1 purchased 20 
ewes paying $80 for same, bor­
rowing a buck. The following 
February these 20 ewes raised 
me 21 lambs all of which lived to 
be grown sheep. The first week 
in June 1911, I sheared $15.75 
worth of wool from the 20 ewes.

1 lost one of the ewes and 
several young lambs during the 
bad weather last winter but 
succeeded in raising 12 lambs 
that are now nearly grown, mak­
ing me 52 sheep up to August 
10th, 1912.

In June 1912 I sheared $53.59 
worth of wool from the 40 head.

In the 2 years the wool has 
been worth $69.34 liking $10.66 
of being the price of my first 
purchase, and besides I now 
have up to August 10 52 sheep 
worth $182 at a low cash esti­
mate. On an investment of 
$80 I have received in cash and 
have on hand sheep to a total 
value of $251.34.

These are facts and figures 
for 2 years from August 10, 1910 
to August 10, 1912.

Since August 10th, I have one 
young lamb and will have sever­
al more fall lambs, and have 
purchased a buck paying $10 
for him.

R. F. Green, my neighbor, 
started into sheep raising on a 
small scale about the time I 
did and has done equally as 
well from the financial stand­
point.

I find sheep very easily cared 
for and very useful on the farm.

4 barbwires make a good 
sheep fence and 5 wires will 
make an excellent sheep and 
cattle fence.

%
They are great weed scaveng­

ers and are death to many of 
our obnoxious weeds. I find 
they will keep blue weeds eaten 
to the ground. I have thorough­
ly tested them on two different 
patches this year, even after 
the weeds were old and tough 
and they ate them to the ground.

If you will start them on a 
grassburr patch in the spring 
when the grass is tender they 
will not let it seed but must not 
be allowed to run in grassburrs 
after they are seeded unless 
you want to damage the sale of 
your wool from 2 to 3 cents per 
pound.

They are sure death to John­
son grass, killing it out in one to 
two years; In fact I find they 
will kill most all weeds common 
to the plains.

They will not eat the devil 
claw or unicorn plant and are 
not very fond of the yellow 
blooming nettle or wild sage 
but they prefer other weeds to 
grass.

If allowed to run in the fields 
they do not pack the ground, 
and make it very rich.

There are many other points 
in their favor that I think it 
will pay our farmers to investi­
gate. To my seeing a small 
bunch of sheep on every farm 
would be a paying investment.

Yours truly,
R. E. L. M u n c y , i

T h e  H esperian 
Piano Contest Coupon

This coupon entitles bearer 
to five votes: to be counted 
for

Date, Sept. 12, 1912 
Not good after ten days

We have now in stock plain j. 
promissory notes, 50 for 10c. 
Statutory Chattel Mortgages and j 
are adding blank forms as op-

COAL, GRAIN, FLOUR, MEAL
WHOLESALE AND RETAIL

Field Seed and Feed Stuff.
N orth  M ain St. N ear Depot.

Newell Brothers

L A N D -A B S T R A C T S
warn'®

■ I

Always see us if you desire to Buy, Sell or Lease Land in 
Floyd or near by Counties, we can shape you up. Remem­
ber we have complete Abstract of Floyd County Lands and 
Lots; we make all Abstracts by copying each instrument in 
full from the records, this is the only way to get complete 
Abstract of-your land.

W . M. M assie  &  Bro.
Floydada, v Texas

Bad Spells
“ I suffered, during girlhood, from womanly weakness,” 

writes Mrs. Mollie Navy, of Walnut, N. C. “At last, i was 
almost bed-ridden, and had to give up. We had three 
doctors. All the time, ! was getting worse. I had bad 
spells, that lasted from 7 to 28 days. In one week, after 1 
gave Cardui a trial, L could eat, sleep, and joke, as well as 
anybody. In 8 weeks, 1 was well. I had been an invalid 
for 5 weary years! Cardui relieved me, when everything 
else failed.”

m

T A K ECardui Woman’sToni*
If you are weak and ailing, think what it would mean, 

to you, to recover as quickly as, Mrs. Navy did. For more *. 
than 50 years, this purely vegetable, tonic remedy,for women; 
has been used by thousands of weak and ailing sufferers. 
They found it of real value in relieving their aches and 
pains. Why suffer longer? A remedy that has relieved 
and helped so many, is ready, at the nearest drug store, for 
use, at once, by you. Try it, today.

Write to: Ladies’ Advisory Dept.. Chattanooga Medicine Co.. Chattanooga, Ter.n., 
for Special Instructions, and 64-page book, " Home Treatment £or Women.” sent free. J

J. F. McCarty

McCarty & Rushing
L and, L o a n s  and  L iv e sto ck  A g en cy

Residence in Floyd County 12 and 22 years
All Business Intrusted To Us Receives Our 

Careful And Prompt Attention 
Office At First State Bank

mmsBrnoBsamamamBm

D. .S' Thomas and Wife
Scientific Massuers

Expert Treatment for all Patients Entrust-
to our care

Floydada, Phone 35 Texas

TlfiSE WITH ME
If you  do n o t b u y  groceries a t  G. R . 
G riggs’ grocery  store you  lose m o n ­
e y  and I lose  w h a t  I ou g h t to h a v e
Fancy  and staple groceries o f every kind are kept— 
the peoples favorite place to trade—the store w here 
your dollar goes the fartherest. W e  are now  sell­
ing the best grade of Hour a t $3.20, second best $2.90. 
P enn ’s fine N a tu ra l L e a f tobacco a t 75c per lb. Bee 
County pure com b honey 15c, and fat No. 1 M ack- 
eral.

Geo. R. Griggs
“JO H N N IE  O N  T H E  S P O T 1’

n H n a u r a a m

V/. E. Honea was in Floydada 
jnv from Loeknev

C. ckney, 
lav ?Än



They Try of Course

But they can’t make 
better flour than Alba­
tross.
They can’t cutter. Alba­
tross has got ’em out­
classed that’s all.

Williams-Brown
.ccessful Candidate for Rail­

road Commissioner.

N. EARLE B. MAYFIELD.
leridian, Texas, August— 
n. Earle B. Mayfield, success- 

1 candidate for Railroad Com- 
~*ho made his cam- 

’atform of “more 
better service” 

¡ncessantly preach- 
- “ live and let live” 

i Railroad Commis- 
.t of progress, a dis- 

tion of fairness, a, desire to 
aerate and a resistless ener- 
uch needed in the work of 
department of government, 

ae is entering the Commis­
ion at the most trying time in 
s existence. Construction 
ark is at a standstill and can 
'dly be stimulated by unrea- 
able bonuses; a pending car 
fine of mammoth proportions 

4 upon us; our passenger ser- 
ce is in need of improvement 
ad the people have cried out to 
9 Commission ^through the 

cate Democratic convention 
)r relief. The service of Mr. 
ayfield will be valuable to the 
ommission in modernizing its 

'hods and adjusting its poli- 
, to Twentieth Century coit­

ions. - 8
Mr. Mayfield served six years 
he State Senate and is at 
'.ent a member of that body. 

.<8 faithfulness, fidelity and 
ùlity have won for him lead- 
ship in the Senate and merited 
* Promotion he has received 

'!  people.

Two Important Items.
Doubtless your readers will be 

pleased to know how the 33d 
Legislature will stand on reform 
measures. Soon after the July 
primary, I sent inquiries into 
every county in the State, to 
ascertain how nominees for the 
Legislature stood. Of course, I 
knew how many of the nominees 
stood, but I made the inquiries 
uniform and general. Except 
as to 11 members of the House 
of Representatives, all of the 
nominees have been certified to, 
by letters on file in the Anti- 
Saloon League office.

In the Senate, there will be 19 
reform members and 12 antis. 
In the House, there will be 82 
reform members and 49 antis. 
As stated, there are 11 mem 
bers of the House whose posi­
tions are not certified to. This 
shows that we are in much bet­
ter shape than many prohibi­
tionists believed we were, and 
that all reform people have 
great reason to be gratified over 
the results of the primary elec­
tion. I t is believed that all 
nominees will stand by the 
pledges they made to their con­
stituents during the campaign.

J. H. Gambrell, 
State Superintendent.

Big Cattle Deals.
Some big cattle deals in Flo y- 

dada and Floyd County, are of 
common occurrence during the 
past four months. Buying and 
shipping is a daily occurrence, 
many of the deals reaching up 
into the tens of thousands of 
dollars.

Advertised Letters.
The following is a list of let­

ters remaining in the Post office 
at Floydada, Texas Sept, 9,1912 
If not called for in one week, 
will be sent to The Dead Letter 
office.

Foster, Mr. Crow, 1. Gatliff, 
Mr.-George, 1. Jackson, VV. G. 
1. Lee, Mrs. Zarsie, 1.

Person calling for above letters 
will please say advertised and 
give date of list.

J. D. Starks Postmaster.

Allen Coalston, * of Parker

White Skinned Eskimos.
Seattle, Wash., Sept. 9.r-Vih- 

jalmar Stefansson, after spend­
ing more than four years in Arc­
tic exploration, returned to Seat­
tle today from Nome, Alaska.

He told of his probable dis­
covery of the descendants of the 
Scandinavian Colinists, who set­
tled in Greenland, and were last 
heard of in 1412 and who, when 
trade with Greenland was re­
sumed in the seventeenth cen­
tury, had disappeared. ,

Stefansson and his companion 
Dr. R. M. Anderson, of Iowa, 
made a valuable zoological and 
enthnological collection which is 
now on the steam whaler Belve­
dere, with Dr. Anderson and 
will arrive at San Francisco by 
the first of November on its way 
to the American museum of Na­
tional History at New York.

Stefans&on will leave for New 
York tomorrow. He reports 
Anderson in excellent health.

During the four years Stefans­
son and Anderson were together 
only nine months, as they could 
cover more ground by separat­
ing.

They went to the Arctic in 
1908 by Winnipeg and down 
MacKenzie river. Leaving the 
Arctic, Stefansson journeyed 
alone with a dog team from 
Cape Parry to Point Barrow, a 
thousand miles, visiting all the 
Eskimo settlements along the 
coast, and discovering olonde 
Eskimos with white skins and 
blue eyes, the first ever known.

Of the so-called white Eskimos 
of Coronation Gulf, Stefansson, 
Said: “They are taller than the 
Greenland Eskimos but not so 
tall as the Alaska Eskimos. 
They spoke Eskimo and lived 
the typical Eskimo way.

I vi'sited thirteen groups of 
these people who numbered two 
thousand. Ten of these tribes 
never had come in contact with 
whites and hadn’t even a tradi­
tion of them.

“ The Blonde Eskimos live well 
and many of them have eyes 
blue as mine and very blonde 
eye brows as a rule. A great 
many have sandy beards-.

“They have'no tradition of 
their anpestry.”

Stefansson ascribes the suc­
cess of his expedition to the fact 
that he took no food supplies 
but went into the country with 
his rifle, and lived as the Eski­
mos did.

F. E. Savage is having erected 
a neat bungalow on his lots near 
the public school in southeast 
Floydada. H. E. Cannaday has 
the contract.

Harmony Happenings.
• Harmony, Tex. Sept. 11, 1912. 
Editor Hesperian:—

A rain would be welcome in 
our community now. If it does 
not rain soon it will be too late 
to do crops any good.

D. T. Scott has recently had a 
concrete Jank:built for the pur­
pose '̂of irrigating his garden. 
S. A Greer superintended the 
woik and we think it a nice job.

Mr. and Mrs. L. E. Williams 
made a trip to Plainview Mon­
day.

Messrs Charles and Warner 
Rose left for Canyon Thursday 
where they will attend The Tex­
as State Normal.

D. T. Scott and family visited 
L. E. William’s Sunday.

Several of the Harmony peo­
ple attended church at Peters­
burg Sunday. Rev. W. H. Carr 
is now holding a meeting at that 
place.

Robert Marshall and family 
who have been visiting relatives 
Mrs. M. M. Rasco returned to 
their home in East Texas Mon­
day.

Etoilede Lyon.

ry soap, 25c. 
B. Olson.

7 bars good 
2tc.

We will have a car of Sweet & 
Pure Flour next wet 

ltc. Duncan Grocery.

Notice! To Borrowers.
We request parties who have 

ar— ’ori our belting, wheelbar- 
**n them at

W. T. Sparks and daughter, 
Miss Beulah, of Crystal City, 
are spending a visit in Floydada 
with Mrs. J. A. Burrus.

7 bars crystal white soap for a 
quarter.

ltc. S. E. Duncan.

G. L. Fawver returned Satur­
day evening from a trip to East­
ern New Mexico. He reports 
sandhills and empty houses the 
most interesting scenery down 
the way.

R. D. Hatched, of Plainview, 
spent some six or eight days in 
Floydada this week and last.

2 cans Quaker Oats for 25c.
ltc. S. E. Duncan.

Jno. P. Mathis, of the firm of 
Mathis-Martin Dry Goods Co., 
left last week for the New York 
market to buy for this enter­
prising firm.

James Cardwell and daughter, 
Miss Daisy, of Warren County, 
Tenn,, are visiting with C. S. 
Lowery and wife, of the Sand­
hill neighborhood. Mr. Card- 
well is a brother of Mrs. Lowery. 
He is delighted with the plains 
in general and Floyd County in 
particular.

- A
Sewing machines at Jones 

Hdw. V 2tc,

Austin Honda, of Locknev, 
was in Floydada Monday.

Good vinegar' 35c per gallon. 
2tc. { 0. B. Olson.

F. M. Butler, who has been 
with the Mathis-Martin Dry 
Goods Co., as bookkeeper, the 
past year, has accepted the same 
position with The First National 
Bank, of this city. No arrange­
ments have been made filling the 
position he vacates.

4 pkgs. Evaporated cranber­
ries two bits.

ltc. S. E. Duncan.

J. H. Green accompanied his 
daughter Miss Jessie Green, to 
Floydada Monday. She was en- 
route to Canyon to attend the 
normal.

Missionary.
We are proud to report better 

attendance at the Missionary 
Society Monday afternoon than 
we have had for quite awhile. 
We are receiving members all 
along. Two came in Monday 
and we hope before the year is 
closed, every lady member of 
the Methodist church will be a 
member of the society. We 
need their help.

We decided to use the foreign 
pledge in placing a student in 
our school at Sangdo, Korea, 
several dollars were paid on it, 
but our treasurer being absent 
we are unprepared to say how 
much has been collected on the 
pledge. We are expecting every 
member to help in this work, 
and we want to raise it by free 
will offering if possible. Please 
do your best and let us know 
pretty soon how much you can 
give, so we will know how much 
we will have and make plansjfor 
raising it if any should be lack­
ing.

On account of several who 
cannot attend the society on 
Monday we have decided to 
change our day to Tuesday af­
ternoon. The meeting will be­
gin promptly at 3 o’clock next 
Tuesday afternoon, (

Program for the day:
Song.
Prayer.
Song.
Scripture— ‘ ‘The Simple Life. ’ ’ 

(Matt. 7:1-12.)
Our institutions of Prevention 

and Rescue.
1. Vashti Industrial school.— 

Mrs. Plumlee.
2. Virginia Jonson Home.— 

Mrs. C. C. Darsey.
Galveston Immigrant Home. — 

Read by Mrs. Calahan*
The Boy Scouts.—Miss Golden 

Goins.
Dismi

ORTER.

Dr» 1~ o f; f k o

Joe McCollum, of Lockney, 
was over in Floyd last Tuesday 
on business.

— i f
A small line of enamel ware at 

close figures.
ltc. S. E. Duncan.

Transfer for F. P. A. Students.
We are asked to notify pros­

pective students of the Presby­
terian Academy that transfer 
will be provided by the Aca­
demy for up-town students at 
8: A. M., at the courthouse and 
at the Baptist Church, returning 
for them at 4: P. M.

J. E. Penick, of Plainview, re­
presenting the McRae construct­
ion company, was in Floydada 
Saturday and Monday.

The most promising out look 
for a good school year is before 
the patrons of Floydada Public 
School. More systematic ar­
rangement of school work, more 
efficient teachers, more school 
spirit, are a part of the mani­
festly excellent conditions under 
which the teacher, patron, board 
and student must labor. This 
augurs well for great amount of 
work to be done this year. It is 
a condition of which our citizen­
ship is proud.

3 small cans tomatoes, 25c. 
ltc. S. E. Duncan.

Henry Haines is spending a 
short visit in Spur, having left 
Tuesday.

Cleve McGee, of Loekney, 
was in the City the earlier part 
of the week.

16 lbs sugar for a dollar, 
ltc. S, E. Duncan,

G. W. Hanks returned from 
R. K. Bruner’s place this week 
where he had been for some 
time building an addition to 
Roy’s ranch house. The addi­
tion makes the residence look 
splendid.

7 boxes bag blue for two bits, 
At Duncan’s. ltc.

Consistent Work Will Win.
The Hesperian is offering one of the prettiest and most a t­

tractive prizes in our contest that a young lady could desire— 
offering it for the purpose of increasing our growing subscrip­
tion list, and the fact that the contestants are doing consistent 
work for the prize is sufficient argument that they realize this 
fact.

Meanwhile, we call attention to the special $5.00 prize, the 
time for which expires next Wednesday. Now, $5 is $5 any­
where in the world, and all YOU have to do to win it is to 
WORK and get your friends to work. What do you sa> ? Do 
you want to win the prize and boost your showing for the 
piano?

Remember the merchants who give tickets for cash pur­
chases—Vickery-Hancock, 0. B. Olson, A. C. Bowers, C. Sur- 
giner & Son, Meriwether & Willis, Glad Snodgrass, Mathis- 
Martin, Kelley Bros—and call for your tickets.

The Standing of the contestants, Wednesday evening, Sept. 
Uth, 1912.

Miss Marguerite Viles, Floydada, 194,890.
Miss Ethel Haines Floydada, 155,950.
Miss Stella Tubbs, Floydada, 152,035.
Miss Maggie Maxey, Center, 49,435.
Miss Rosa Donathan, Lakeview, 25,545.
Miss Florence Nelson, Floydada, 22,310.
Mrs. O. P. Darsey, Floydada, 14 ,205.
Mrs, M. L Mullins, Sandhill, 8,320.
I certify that the above count is correct.

(signed) J. C. Gaither.

=

Don’t Forget
The City Market will deliver your 
Meat. Always fresh, clean and 
fat. We want your business.

Flynn & Cope

School Is Oper
The time is now at hand for yi 

to buy your school shoes and yo 
suits for boys. I have the bes 
school shoe ever has been brougl 
to Floydada. The clothing for bo' 
is first class in quality and low 
prices. Competition can’t me 
the prices I make, the quality coi 
sidered. Give me a chance and 
will show you.

0. B. 0LS(
The House that sells the same Goods for Let



I BOWERS SAYS - j

“All the latest and best in the fall and winter wearables are on display at our store. We keep only the 
best and most dependable lines of merchandise. New goods are arriving daily and we are prepared to take 
care of a big share of the fall and winter trade. Our line of men’s clothing is the best that money can b u y -  
up-to-date styles and patterns line our counters-that’s the ONLY kind we buy. Ladies dress goods, notions 
-and by the way-Hamilton, Brown Shoes- “They keep the quality up.” The Security school shoe is the best 
for the school boy or girl. Let us show you.”

I 
L

A. C. BOWERS
Dry Goods, Clothing, Shoes North Side Square

I
u

Treatment of Smut.

During the past season, a 
great deal of smui has developed 
in the wheat crop, which has 
caused serious loss to the g row ­
ers. It not only causes a loss in 
yield but also in the selling price 
I t  is safe to say that the grower 
f smutty wheat does not receive 
ver one half the profits from it 
hat would come from clean 

wheat.
By carefully looking over the 

wheat field at maturing time, 
leads may be found which have 
been entirely destroyed. The 
wheat kernels have become 
nothing more than a black mass 
of spores. When the crop is 
threshed, many of these spores 
cling to the grain and are carried 
back to the wheat field at seed-' 
ing time. Soon after the wheat 
kernels germinate, the smut 
spores also germinate. The ger­
minated spore or fungus devel­
ops a thread like structure which 
enters the wheat plant. This

ICE! ICE!
The wagon IS now m aking  
regu lar deliveries. Arrange­
ments can be made w ith  
driver for T IC K E T S  and or­
ders. W e a llow  20 percent 
discount on T IC K E T S . A ll 
sales CASH. Phone No. S 3 .»  
W hite D rug Co.

G. A. E ID E R .

does not appear to damage the 
wheat plant very much during 
its growing period, but it is 
there ready for work as soon as 
the wheat heads appear.

There are two kinds of wheat 
smut, loose and stinking smut. 
Both can be prevented by trea t­
ing the seed and rotating the 
crops. The spores of both kinds 
of smut are carried by the seed, 
but the spores of loose smut may 
also be carried in the soil from 
one year to another. Treating 
the seed prevents stinking smut, 
but loose smut requires that the 
seed be treated and the ground 
on which it grew be planted to 
another crop the following year. 
The stinking smut is the kind 
most commonly found, it de­
stroys the kernels only, while 
the loose smut destroys the 
grain and chaff entirely and the 
sooty mass of spores remain. 
The stinking smut gives off an 
offensive odor when broken.

The following “ Formaline 
Treatment” will prevent stink­
ing smut in wheat, also the 
smuts which commonly affect 
barley and oats:

Formalin treatment—There
are several methods of treat­
ment; hot water treatment, blue 
stone treatment, and formalin 
treatment, the last of which is 
safest, most reliable and cheap­
est.

Secure a 40 per cent solution 
of formalin at a reliable drug 
store. One pound of formalin 
is sufficient to treat from 2000 to

Three “ Squares”  a Day
W e  w an t to  announce to the public th a t w e have 

an experienced cook and are  ready to  serve our p a ­
trons T H R E E  R E G U L A R  M E A L S  D A IL Y  and 
short orders a t all hours. W e  will serve the best 
the  m arket affords, giving your w an ts  prom pt, cour­
teous attention. T ry  us once.

Jones Brothers
A t the  Old B usy Bee Cafe S tand

■10YDADA
’resbyterian Academy
ae place to send Boys and Girls.
h class A cadem ic w ork.

Christian Training.
' and Board $175 per year, 

id Elocution.

rrthur Information apply to

lobt. S. Bailey, Pres.

2500 pounds of wheat. Before 
mixing the solution, get the seed 
wheat ready. The treating solu­
tion is made by carefully mixing 
a pound bottle of the formalin 
with 40 gallons of water.

The seed may be treated by 
dipping or sprinkling. To dip, 
the seed may be placed in a gun­
ny sack and the solution in a 
barrel or tank. The wheat should 
be immersed in this for at least 
ten minutes and then taken out 
and allowed to drain back into 
the barrel fo ra  short time. The 
wheat should then be emptied in 
to a pile in a clean place and cov­
ered with sacks or blankets for 
two hours, after wnicn it should 
be thoroughly dried before sow­
ing.

To sprinkle, ^prepare a clean 
place on a canvas or smooth 
floor. Thoroughly sprinkle the 
place with the solution before 
spreading the wheat on it. Now 
thoroughly sprinkle the spread 
out wheat and at the same time 
shovel it over. Continue to sprin- 
le and shovel over the wheat un­

til it is thoroughly moistened. 
Next, shovel the wheat into a 
pile and cover with sacks or 
blankets for two hours, after 
which it should be thoroughly 
dried before sowing. Dj) not al­
low the wheat to remain wet too 
long after treating as the ger­
minating qualities may be in­
jured.

Place the dried wheat in sacks 
which have been dipped fn the 
solution, i t  is also advisable to 
sprinkle th« grain drill with the 
solution before using it. Exer­
cise -every precaution not to 
bring the treated seek in contact 
with any that has not been treat­
ed or in bins which have con­
tained smut wheat. The wheat 
should be treated but a short 
time before sowing it.

H. M. Bainer,
Agricultural Demonstrator A. T. 
& S. F. Jt. R  Co.

If you want the best drill on 
the market C. Surginer & Son 
handle the Superior. See them.

2tc.

trying to improve conditions 
down that way.

C. M. Wilson and Glenn Flinn 
accompanied by Misses Ethel 
Haines and Clyde Hodge spent 
a very pleasant day last Sunday 
in a cross country trio to Lub­
bock in Charley’s Maxwell.

fashioned hom-3 cans of old 
iny 25c.

Ite. S. E. Duncan.

A lawn party Tuesday even­
ing at Mrs. Opal Farris’ was a 
very enjoyable occassion for 
those in attendance. The even­
ing was spent playing croquet 
“and eating ice cream nearly all 
the time,”

The guests were: Misses 
Windsor, Adams, Winn and Ed­
wards; Messrs. Patton, Smith, 
Yeale and Gamble.

3 cans of sugar corn for 25c at 
Duncans Grocery. ltc.

R. G. Bennett and Hugh New- 
lin, of Memphis, are in Floyd- 
ada visiting with the Slaughters,
E. C. and G. V., and families. 
Mr. Bennett is an uncle of theirs. 
They report Memphis and Hall 
County in excellent condition.

C. Surginer & Son sells the 
famous Superior D rill- every­
thing that “superior” stands 
for. 2tc.

Notice Fairview People.
I will be at Fairview to fill my 

regular appointment Sunday, 
Sept. 15.

G. W. Shearer.

An all-wool pant, $1.25.
2tc. O. B. Olson.

If you neotrany steam plowing 
done see G /W. Moore at Boer- 
ner’s plaça sutheast of Floydada 
12tc,

Bumblebee sorghum 40c per 
gallon at S. É. Duncans, ltc.

Warning.
All parties are warned that 

thé hitching ordinance of the 
City of Floydada Will be strictly 
enforced frpm this date.

J. R. McPeak, City Marshall.

Moved.
Next door to Post Office. New 

goods will arrive daily until my 
stock will be complete.

Drop in and see just how that 
fall suit is going to look before 
its made up.

Glad Snodgrass.
Outfitters for men and boys.

ltc.

Time to sow ' winter wheat. 
Buy the Superior p rill—stand­
ard the world ovej>4t C. Surgin­
er & Son’s. " " 2tc.

Blanco Pickups.
Since last writing we have 

had more good rains which were 
very welcome indeed.

Misses Myrtle and Winnie Mc­
Lain visited Misses Bertha and 
Ora Womack Thursday last.

C. D. Thacker is intending to 
ship another car of hogs this 
week.

Messrs Olan Reagan, Jake 
Greer, Warner and Charlie Rose 
left last Tuesday for Canyon 
City where they will attend 
school. We regret very much 
their leaving.

Price Scott left this week for 
Canyon City where he will at­
tend school also we will miss 
him very much in Sunday school.

Messrs Charlie and Gay Keas- 
ler left Monday for Hardeman 
Co., where they intend to pick 
the fleecy staple.

Miss Bertha Mullens was very 
sick one day recently.

Terrell Rose and Misses Myrtle 
and Winnie McLain, Collins 
and Bonnie Greer, visited Mr. 
Keaslers Saturday evening. 
Ice cream and cake was served 
after which the young people 
amused themselves by kodaking. 
All report a nice time.

Quite a lot of the young people 
attended church at Petersburg 
Sunday.

Mrs. Hanna spent the day 
with Mrs. Keasler Tuesday last, j

Mr and Mrs. Will McCarty 
returned last week from New 
Mexico where they had been 
visiting.

Mr. Hanna was a Floydada 
visitor Saturday.

Mr. Marcus Whitlow was a 
Floydada visitor Friday.

“Two old Maids,” come again. 
We like to read your breezy let­
ters. Also Etoyle De Lyon.

The Lost Chicken.

Bennett—Thornton.
Clyde K Bennett and Mis 

Bertie Thornton both of Lock 
ney, were married last Sunday

They are loth of highly res­
pected families. Mr. Bennet 
being the son of R C. Bennett 
the well-known stock farme 
and land-holder near Lockney 
and Miss Thornton a sister o 
Mrs. Ross Cope, a daughter o 
T. J. Thornton.

They will live near Lockney.
The young couple are populai 

among the young people of tha 
vicinity and have many friends 
who will join in extending con 
gratulations.

General Rain.
Wednesday evening a generc 

rain over Floyd County fell, th< 
precipitation amounting in tot 
to a half inch at Floydada.

Local showers have falle 
continuously the past week tek 
phone reports bearing the new 
as we go to press that the nort 
end of the county is receivi 
heavy precipitation.

F. C. Harmon left last Satu 
day for Taylor on business.

Arm & Ha 
for 25c at Du

a, 4 pkg. 
ocery. ltc.

Rev. Sam J. Franks, of San 
Angelo, is out on a visit with his 
nephew, D. T- Scott and family. 
He will assist Rev. Carr in a 
meeting which begins at Allmon 
at an early date.

Born.—To Mr. and Mrs. E. L. 
Morris Sept, 9th, a 12-pound 
boy. Elder is a very proud 
father. Mother and child both 
reported dointr fin

White ? 
1 at 65c pe 
eery.

syrup 
1 Gro- 
ltc.

The people of Texas think 
that their taxes are very high, 
but w.hat would they say if an 
apppropriation of $300,000 were 
set aside for advertising each 
year? Go up in the air, more 
than likely. But one state in 
the South is doing this very 
thing this year—a state with 
about one-eighth the resources 
of the state of Texas spending 
through their legislature $300,- 
000 for advertising! I t is none 
other than Florida. But some 
folks are raising their hands in 
holy horror because a session of 
the business men of this state in 
Houston the other day, laid plans 
for spending $60,000 advertis­
ing Texas this coming year. 
Guess that there won't be any 
immigration from Texas to Flor­
ida soon— “ fU 
high” —thr

Notice.
Rev. C. S. Fields, Secretary of 

the International Sunday School 
Association, will occupy the 
pulpit, at the Methodist Church, 
Sunday morning and night. He 
will interest and instruct. All 
Sunday School workers would do 
well to attend. His work is 
Inter denominational.

Everybody invited-
G. W. Shearer, P. C.

Red Velva Ribbon canesyrup at 
65c per gallon. Duncan’s, ltc-

New Garage
J. H. Reagan is erecting a 

large new garage on California 
street which will be when comp­
leted 40x70 feet in dimensions. 
And as nearly fire proof as pos-
gjhlo

West Side Meat Market.
We now invite your attenti 

to the West Side Meat Marl 
located at Williams-Brown Gro­
cery store. We are here to serve 
the good people of Floydada and 
the surrounding country. We 
invite one and all to come in ar 
inspect our market. We exp 
to carry a full line of meats, a 
also will deliver to any part 
town at any hour. We will i 
preciate your orders let it 
large or small for we need yoi 
support.

Hatchell & a

GETTING EVEN Wf
Japanese Servant Devi.

Seheme for Punishmej..
Cheap Marauder.

A physician who keeps a Jap 
house servant was having new 
Ing laid in his offices. The Jap; 
was greatly disturbed by the 
men, who interfered with the smootJ 
ness of his household routine. Or 
day he came to his m aster with 
look of alarm. One ef the workur 
had been stealing eggs from 1 
pantry.

“Stealing eggs,” said the doc 
“how’s th a t?”

“k, watch,” explained the Jap. 
see him put something in his co 
tha t hang in the hall. I look 
pocket and find eggs; I look in panti 
and don’t find eggs. I will go ta 
them ba“ck from the pocket.” •=
... “Oh, no,” seM tke doctor. “Th. 

would be no ber***sr $ian taking tlie 
from the pantr\ You must nev< 
take anything from another man 
pocket.”

The Jap went away with a look 
disappointment. A few minutes 1 
the doctor passed the hatrack in 
hall where the workmen’s coats w< 
hanging and found the Jap beat 
the coats with a rug beater.

“What are you doing?” erclai 
the doctor as he saw the dust r  
from the coats.

“I beat all the coats alike,” said U 
“and the eggs, they oaly ja *  

’̂ a  bad man sorry.”

hht Identified
M n. Ttoat—Have von 

•race of poor dee^Specl 
*e re


