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Glenda Allison And Bill Dyess. Were Married' 
May 12 In Pretty Church Service At Hereford

Number 22

Forty-two honor students will 
be honored with an awards 
banquet to be held in the school 
<3afeteria Friday at 8:00 p. m. 
These students have maintain­
ed an average of 90 or above in 
five academic subjects during 
the school year. Gold pins 
“With chevrons for each year the 
student has maintained the 
honor average will be presented 
to the students.
Honored Seniors 

Donna Boner, Shelia Donelson, 
Joe Elms, Sue Hudson, Gary 
Garoutte, and Laurina Riggs. 
Honored Juniors 

Jeanette Bard well, Gail Be ver, 
Millie James, Lorelei Harding, 
Bill Kirkwood, Joe Minkley, 
Jack Morgan, Dan Newman, 
Mike Peterson, Linda Plunk, Ann 
Pronger, Jack Standefer and 
Louise Stone.
Honored Sophomores 

Charlotte Eller, Cynthia Heil, 
Gary Hudson, Judy Hudson, 
Lanita Judd, Dorma Moon, 
Marie Moore, Señora Mullican, 
Beth Naylor, Dennie Plunk, Sue 
Plunk, Carol Reeder and Ken­
neth Scott.
Honored Freshmen 

Tommy Blake, Charlotte 
Guthrie, Sheri Hudson, Jimmy 
Hudson, Eddie Moon, Bobby 
Pendleton, Kathy Sneed, Judy 
Standefer, Carolyn Wright and 
Teri Wilson.

Frank McCowan, Dumas a t­
torney, will be the principal ban­
quet speaker. Duard Lamb will 
emcee the program. The pre­
sentation of scholastic pins will 
be made by R. W. Standefer Jr.

Louise Stone will give the in­
vocation and Jack Standefer 
will pronounce the benediction.

Lorelei Harding will make a 
brief talk and Jack Morgan Will 
play several piano selections.

A trio composed of Ann Pron­
ger, Beth Naylor and Charlotte 
Guthrie, will sing, accompanied 
a t the piano by Sue Hudson.

The welcome address will be 
presented by a school trustee.

Mrs. Peach Smith 
Named Sorority 
Woman Of Year

Indians Are 
Leading Little 
League Games

The Indians are in first place 
in  the Little League after de­
feating the Braves 25 to 15 in 
the  game Tuesday night.

The Indians are sponsored by 
Th^ First State Bank and 
c ^ h e d  by Walter Vincent and 
J  ̂ W. Wilson. The Braves are 
sponsored by King Equipment 
Co. and coached by George 
Tidmore and J. B. Parker Jr.

Mike Vincent was the win­
ning pitcher and Danny Brooks 
was the losing pitcher.

The Yankees lost their game 
to the Giants 3 to 0. The Yan­
kees are sponsored by Con­
sumers Co. and coached by 
Chuck Smith and Pete Bateman. 
The Giants are sponsored by 
Stratford Grain Co. and coached 
by Duard Lamb and Rev. M. E. 
Upchurch.

Wayne Smith was the losing 
pitcher and Mark Lamb was the 
winning pitcher.

League Standings
W L

Indians 5 2
Giants 2 5
Braves 3 4
Yankees 4 3
Two games will be played Fri­

day night. The Giants and In ­
dians play at 6:00 o’clock and 
the Yankees and Braves meet at 
8:00 o’clock.

Mrs. Mary Peach Smith
Nu Beta chapter of Beta 

Sigma Phi recently held its an­
nual Woman of the Year cof­
fee. The event was held at the 
Fellowship Hall of the First 
Methodist Church. Members’ 
mothers were special guests for 
the event, and after being regis­
tered by Mrs. Alvin Engelbrecht, 
a lovely corsage of white with 
red tip carnations was given to 
each of the special guests.

Acting as mistress of ceremon­
ies, Mrs. Charles Carter wel­
comed the guests, ladies present 
who had previously been Woman 
of the Year, and then in a 
“It could be you” fashion, re­
vealed the new Woman of the 
Year, Mrs. Mary Peach Smith, 
who received a beautiful plaque 
and one dozen long stem red 
roses.

Mrs. Jim Taylor narrated the 
many outstanding deeds Mary 
Peach had done. Mary Peach 
came to Texas from Missouri in 
1925 as a  young elementary 
school teacher. Married in 1926 
to Peach Smith, a local farmer, 
she gave up teaching and mov­
ed to the country. In  1955 they 
moved back into town and she 
resumed teaching. Everybody 
that is acquainted with her 
knows her as a good friend, a 
wonderful neighbor and up­
standing citizen of the com­
munity.

Special guests included mem­
bers of the elementary faculty, 
Mrs. O. H. Finch and Mrs. King 
Fike of Dalhart, and Mrs. Clar­
ence Lutes of Pampa. A love­
ly guest book, made by Virgie 
Biddy, in which the guests re­
gistered as they arrived, was 
presented to the honoree.

Mrs. Charlene Oquin, presi­
dent of the Exemplar chapter, 
alternated in serving with Mrs. 
V. O. Lasley, president of the 
Nu Beta chapteï.

The serving table was laid 
With a white table cloth edged 
with red net. A center piece of 
White candles and white carna­
tions was tipped in red. .. Serv­
ed were coffee with miniature 
doughnuts, finger rolls, nuts and 
mints.

Don’t marry on Sunday. I t ’s 
unlucky to gamble on the Sab­
bath.

Vet Day Service 
AtlOOnMaySO
Miss Harding’s 
Engagement Is 
Announced

Memorial Day services spcm— 
sored by the American Legion, 
will open at the Stratford Cem­
etery at 10:00 a. m. Thursday, 
May 30.

“For those who gave their aE 
that we might live in a free 
country, and lest we forget, we 
will have the opportunity to  
again be reminded by the ser­
vices from 10:00 to 12:00 a. m. 00 
May 30, by an address from 
Willis Hawkins, Ex-Commander 
of the 18th District of the Am­
erican Legion.

All citizens of Stratford an(t 
the surrounding community are 
invited to attend. Please mark 
your calendar for observance of 
the hours from 10:00 to 12:00 a. 
m. May 30 that you may feel 
you have a  part in this great 
country of ours”, annoimced 
Mayor Harold Oquin.

Decorating of the graves of 
veterans, the firing squad and 
color guard rituals, will be in­
cluded in the Memorial Day 
Service.

MRS. WILLIAM ALFRED DYESS

CARD OF THANKS
Thanks SO much to my dear 

friends, neighbors and relatives 
for all the kindnesses shown 
during my illness. A very spe­
cial Thank You for the lovely 
flowers, gifts, cards, letters and 
visits. May God bless each of 
you is my sincere prayer.

Mary Belle Cummings

Miss Glenda .Agnes .Allison, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
R. Allison of Hereford, and Wil­
liam Alfred Dyess, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Roscoe Dyess of S trat­
ford, exchanged wedding vows 
on May 12 in the sanctuary of 
the First Methodist Church in 
Hereford.

Rev. Herschel L. Thurston, 
pastor of the First Methodist 
Church, read the double ring 
ceremony as the couple knelt on 
a white satin kneeling bench 
before an altar flanked by four 
wedding candelabra, filled with 
white wedding tapers and en­
twined with greenery, and two 
baskets of white gladioius and 
greenery.

The church aisles were laid 
with white cloth and the family 
pews .»were marked with white 
satin bows.

Mrs. Bill Stanford of Plain- 
view, organist, played tradition­
al wedding selections and ac­
companied Miss Kay Spurlock of 
Stratford as she sang “Because”, 
“Whither Thou Goest” and “The 
Lord’s Prayer”.

Mrs. Edwin Morrison Jr. of 
Hereford attended the bride as 
matron of honor. Mrs. Dan 
Evans of Lubbock and Mrs. Jack 
Fulgham of Friona were brides- 
matrons. Bridesmaids were 
Miss Mary Dufur of Hereford 
and Miss Joan Hubbell of Can­
yon. All the attendants wore 
light pink cotton dresses fash­
ioned with scoop necklines, cap 
sleeyes, box-pleated skirts with 
over-skirts of .jvhite cotton lace. 
They wore matching pink shoes,, 
short white ^gloves, and ^alo 
hats made of pink net. Cor­
sages for the attendants were 
French colonial nosegays of 
pink roses.

Misses Carol Ann Massingill 
and Mary Lynn Massingill of 
Eastland, cousins of the bride, 
served as flower girls. They 
wore dresses identical to the a t­
tendants, short white gloves and 
white fish net starched hats, 
and carried baskets of pink rose 
petals. Candlelighters were 
Edward Allison, brother of the 
bride, and Ellen Dyess of S trat­
ford, sister of the groom. She 
wore an identical costume to the

other attendants and a pink 
wristlet corsage. The organist 
and assistants at the reception 
wore white pom-pom corsages.

Ernie Dyess of Stratford, a t­
tended his brother as best man. 
Groomsmen were Henry Har­
rison and Richard McMinn, of 
Stratford; and Robert Ragsdale 
and Robert Spoonmore of Can­
yon. Ushers were Gary Stein- 
berger of Canyon, Bill Minkley 
of Lubbock, and Edward Allison 
of Hereford, brother of the 
bride. Ring bearer, Charles Al­
lison of Hereford, brother of the 
bride, carried the rings on a 
white satin pillow.

The bride, given in marriage 
by her father, was attired in a 
formal wedding gown of import­
ed French Chantilly lace en­
hanced with sequins and seed 
pearls. The bodice was fash­
ioned with a scalloped neckline, 
long fitted sleeves tapering to 
petal points over the hands. 
The nylon tulle skirt was pleat­
ed to the bodice of lace and fell 
into a chapel train. The skirt 
was enriched with embroidered 
lace appliques. Her fingertip 
veil of French silk illusion was 
attached to a tiara of seed 
pearls and sequins. The bridal 
bouquet was a white cattleya 
orchid with a purple throat ar­
ranged in a cascading bouquet 
of white roses.

Mrs. Allison, mother of the 
bride, was attired in a blue lace 
dress accented with bone acces­
sories. The groom’s mother, 
Mrs. Dyess, was dressed in a 
blue ensemble with white acces­
sories. Both mothers wore 
pink rose corsages.

Immediately following  ̂ the 
qeremony the bride’s parents 
hosted a , reception in Fellowship 
Hall of the church. Parents of 
the couple and members of the 
bridal party formed the receiv­
ing line.

'The bride’s table, laid with a 
white satin cloth with an over­
skirt of white net, sequin trim ­
med, was appointed in crystal 
and silver with the bride’s bou­
quet forming the centerpiece. 
The arrangement was flanked 
by silver candelabra filled with

twisted tapers. The three tier­
ed wedding cake was white with 
pink rosebuds as decorations 
and surrounded by pink roses.

Alternating at the serving ta ­
ble were Mrs. Ray Joe Riley of 
Hart, Mrs. Durven Baker of 
Lubbock, Mrs. Robert Ragsdale 
of Canyon, and Miss Merle Rae 
Miller of Gorman. Presiding at 
the guest register was Miss Bet­
ty Scott of Hereford.

When the couple left on a 
short wedding trip, the bride 
was attired in a blue linen suit, 
gold shoes and purse, beige hat 
and gloves, and wearing the 
white purple-throated cattleya 
orchid lifted from the bridal 
bouquet.

After May 25 Mr. and Mrs. 
E>yess will be at home in Waco.

The bride is a 1960 graduate of 
Hereford High School and has 
attended West Texas State Col­
lege two years. Mr. Dyess is a 
1958 graduate of Stratford High 
School. He received a Bache­
lor of Science degree from West 
Texas State College May 19. He 
is affiliated with the Kappa 
Alpha Order National Social 
Fraternity. Dyess was president 
of his senior graduating class, 
a member of the Inter-frater­
nity council, and was legal coun­
selor on the student senate. He 
is enrolled in Baylor University 
Law School.

Among the out of town guests 
attending the wedding were Mr. 
and Mrs. Roscoe Dyess and El­
len, Mr. and Mrs. Ernie Dyess, 
Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Pronger Jr., 
and Jana, Mr. and Mrs. Fritz 
Steinberger, Mr. and Mrs. T. L. 
Wakefield, Miss Kay Spurlock/ 
Henry Harrison and Richard 
McMinn of Stratford, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Ragsdale, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gary Steinberger, Mr. and 
Mrs. Marvin Cotton of Canyon; 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Minkley of 
Lubbock and Carl Kirkwood and 
Hal Bennett of Stratford; Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Summerour and 
Donna of Dalhart.

Lorelei Harding
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Harding 

announce the forthcoming mar­
riage of their daughter, Lorelei, 
to Dale Carman, son of Mrs. 
W. M. Carman and the late Mr. 
Carman of Carmargo, Okla­
homa.

Vows will be solemnized Sun­
day, July 15, the First Bap­
tist Church at 2:30 p. m.

Miss Harding is a student in 
Stratford High School.

Mr. Carman attended Okla­
homa State University and is a 
graduate of Panhandle A. & M. 
College of Goodwell, Oklahoma.

The only use for a time-table 
today is to tell how late the 
trains are.

John Miller 
Operation Is 
Scheduled

John Miller is scheduled to 
undergo surgery in John Sealey 
Hospital in Galveston this week. 
Although the operation requires 
four hours, it is not consider­
ed serious.

The operation will be perform­
ed to prevent Miller from los­
ing his eyesight. He has been 
in the hosptal for three weeks 
and the doctors have been mak­
ing various tests. The opera­
tion has been delayed several 
times due to the large number 
of emergency cases the special­
ist has handled.

John Miller hopes to be able 
to return home within about 
10 days after the operation is 
performed, his wife said this 
week.

7 Stratfordites 
Get Degrees 
At Canyon

Seven Stratford students re­
ceived their degrees from West 
Texas State College Sunday. 
They included: Gary Steinber­
ger, Tom Lavake, Bill Dyess, 
Mary Janice Boren, John Sea­
man, Doug Roark and Mrs. Ray­
mond Kirkwood.

Those from this area attend­
ing the graduation service were: 
Mr. and Mrs. Roscoe Dyess, Mrs. 
A, E. Pronger, Rev. and Mrs. 
Raymond T. Dyess, Mr. and Mrs. 
Fritz Steinberger, Mr. and Mrs. 
Edd C. Garoutte, Mrs. Ernest 
Cummings, Mrs. Darrell Cotney, 
and children, Kim and Kay, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dick Woolsey and Ka­
ren, Ellen Dyess, Judy Stein­
berger, Mr. and Mrs. Lester 
Plunk, Mr. and Mrs. Earl Kirk­
wood, Bill Kirkwood, Mrs. Eunice 
Buster, Mr. and Mrs. Allen 
Boren, Mrs. C. V. Collins, Mr. 
and Mrs. Russell Kelp, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ernest Kelp, Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Lavake, Mr. and Mrs. Ken­
neth Knight and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernie Dyess.

•  Correction
The name of Nancy Oquin 

should have appeared in the list 
of Eighth Grade graduates pub­
lished last week.

EXPRESSION OF THANKS
I wish to express my sincere 

thanks to my friends and neigh­
bors for the cards, letters, gifts 
and flowers while I was in the 
hospital and since I returned 
home. Thanks to all who call­
ed on me personally, and to 
those who brought food to my 
home. Your thoughtfulness is 
deeply appreciated.

Mrs. Gene Wilson

It seems that dolls that cry 
“mama” when you squeeze them 
have gone out of style.

Stratford Lions 
Will Install 
New Officers

Stratford Lions will install 
newly elected officers at their 
regular meeting in the County 
Exhibit Building Monday night.

Officers to be installed are: 
Don Riffe, president; Gene Wil­
son, secretary; Charles Wis­
dom, first vice-president; Sam 
Wohlford, second vice-presi­
dent; Walter Lasley, third vice- 
president; C. L. Gaylord, U cn 
Tamer; Arthur L. Golden, Tiail 
Twister; and D. W. Boner and  
E. Goule, directors for the 1962- 
64 term of office.

Holdover directors for the 
1962-63 term of office are Bill 
Riffe and Charles Carter.

Beauty Spot 
Of The Week

Climbing roses in yards over 
the city are exceptionally beau­
tiful. Climbing roses on the 
fence in the yard of Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmer Hudson have been 
selected as the beauty spot of 
the week.
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Bachman Child 

Is Winner In 
Reining Event __

A five year old Dalhart girl 
riding “Miss Fan Cody”, her mo­

ther’s barrel mare, won the Jun­
ior Reining contest Saturday at 
Boise City in connection with 
Santa Fe Trail Day.

She was Emma Lou Bachman, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Mel­
vin Bachman of Dalhart.

There were 12 entries in the 
contest. Emma Lou’s trophy 
v;as a bronze belt buckle.

LET US CHECK YOUR

Generator
Before You Get Caught On The Road

WE REPAK AND REBUILD 
G E N E R A T O R S

IT’S TIME FOR A
SPRING TUNE-UP

DRIVE IN TODAY

Quality Automotive Service
On U. S. Highway 287 At North Second

Phone 396-5391 Dave Olson, Mgr.

We Will Handle
All Types and Varieties

Field
Seed

this year

Sold From Our Location 

In The

ELLER SEED BARN 

On U. S. Highway 54 *

AT PRESENT WE HAVE

Sugraze Hybrid Sudan Seed 
California Sweet Sudan 

Certified Regular Hegari
WE WILL SOON HAVE

WAC Hybrid Maize 
Excel Texas Hybrid Maize

«

For Your Convenience — We Offer

GOOD-YEAR TIRES 
EXIDE BATTERIES

25 Brands Of

MOTOR OILS
WE HONOR ALL CREDIT CARDS

287 Truck Stop
J. L. ADAMS, Manager

If We Don't Have It In Stock 
Let Us Know and We Will 

Get It For You."

Horace Sneed
Phone 396-2861

Christian Church 
Bible School 
Opens Monday

A Vacation Bible School will 
be held at the First Christian 
Church in Stratford May 28 to 
June 1. Sessions will be held 
each afternoon from 2:30 to 4:30 
p. m.

Mrs. Don Gurley will direct 
the school with the assistance 
of Mrs. Jack Heil.

Mrs. Katie Palmer and Mrs. 
Sherri Smith will conduct the 
nursery. Mrs. Lori Dietrich and 
Mrs. Doris Tyler will lead the 
kindergarten group. Mrs. 
Charlene Oquin and Bar­
bara Stublefield will teach pri­
mary one group, and Mrs. H. Ce­
cil Bever and Jeanette Bard- 
well will lead primary two group. 
Mrs. Zella Gifford and Mrs. 
Connie Oquin will conduct the 
junior program. Jonna Knight 
will help on publicity and photo­
graphy. Mrs. Willis Naugle will 
assist in the kitchen, and the 
music will be arranged by Mrs. 
Joyce Ann Lasley and Orlanda 
Lasley.

Gail Bever will supervise the 
w'orship. The theme of the 
school is “Our Bible”.

The building is air-condition­
ed and will toe comfortable in 
the afternoons. Various young 
people will assist with the re­
creation. All children are wel­
come.

Mrs. Wakefield 
Entertains 
CWF Guild

The C.W.F. Guild of the First 
Christian Church, met with Mrs. 
Tom Wakefield Monday night at 
7:30.

The group leader, Mrs. Bob 
Stublefield, opened the meeting 
with prayer. Minutes of the 
last meeting were read and ap­
proved. Roll call was answered 
by six members.

The following officers were 
elected for the coming year: 
Mrs. Bernard Dovel, group lead­
er; Mrs. Frank Sutton, secre­
tary and treasurer; Mrs. Tom 
Wakefield, study chairman; 
Miss Minnie Laura Jackson, 
worship chairman; Mrs. Russell 
Garrison, service chairman; 
Mrs. Laura Lowe, membership 
chairman; and Mrs. Bob Stuble­
field, reporter.

The council report was given 
by Mrs. Bob Stublefield.

Miss Minnie Laura Jackson 
gave the devotional from the 
100th Psalm.

The lesson was given by Mrs. 
Bernard Dovel on the 5th chap­
ter of Ephesians with a discus­
sion by the group.

The meeting was dismissed 
with prayer.

New Arrival
Mr. and Mrs. Elwood Gillis of 

Pueblo, Colorado became par­
ents of a seven pound twelve and 
one-half ounce daughter at 1:19 
p. m. Saturday, May 19. The 
little girl has been named 
Sharon Elaine. She was born 
in a  Pueblo Hospital. Mr. and 
Mrs. Gillis have another daugh­
ter, Jayme. Maternal grand­
parents of the girls are Mr. and 
Mrs. H, L. McMahen and the 
paternal grandfather is Clyde 
Gillis. Mrs. D. D. Woodall is a 
miaternal great grandm oth^.

Mrs. McMahen is in Pueblo with 
her daughter and family.

Don’t  be as uncertain as the 
weather — use Star ads.

DR. G. D. CUYTON
O P T O M E T R I S T

DALHART MEDICAL AND PROFESSIONAL BLDG. 
HOURS: 9:00—12:00 1:30—6:00

9:00—12:00 SATURDAYS

Phone 249-2841 Dalhart, Texas

i - C O N O I T I O N H i S  w i t h

District Girls 
Auxiliary 
Banquet Friday

The Trans-Canadian Associa- 
tional Junior Girls Auxiliary 
banquet was held Friday night. 
May 18, at 7:00 p. m. in the 
First Baptist Church of 
Stratford with girls and their 
counsellors from all 12 churches 
in the association attending.

The theme was “Go-go-go for 
the stars” with rockets, space 
men, flying saucers and star­
shaped nut cups in the Girls 
Auxiliary colors of yellow, green 
and white as decorations. A 
large green rainbow with five 32 
inch gold stars was behind the 
head table. On the stars were 
posters representing the five 
star ideals of the Girls Auxil­
iary.

Stars of thanks, (the invoca­
tion), was given by Mrs. Pruett 
Adkins, WMU president. Mas­
ter star was Mrs. M. E. Up­
church.

Filling stars were the 
astronomer’s dream of Mars 
ham, pleides salad, polester 
green beans, meteors potatoes, 
Venus hot rolls, Saturn punch, 
and Milky Way ice cream sand­
wich.

Singing stars were the six 
Y.W.A.s, Donna Ford, Charlotte 
Guthrie, Grovene DeBord, Grace 
Limer, Laurina Riggs and Kaye 
Roberson, accompanied by Mrs. 
M. B. Carey, who sang “Some­
where over the Rainbow” and 
“Go, Go, Go for the Stars”. Then 
Mrs. Carey led the group in 
singing the latter song.

Following the Star of Stars, 
Mrs. C. J. Humphrey, District 10 
W.M.U. president, was the guest 
speaker and showed slidcis and 
told of a recent trip to Africa.

The Last Star (benediction), 
was given by Mrs. R. C. Lening, 
Trans-Canadian Associational 
W.M.U. president of Dumas.

Trash Containers 
On Main Street

Several trash containers sold 
to business firms by the Strat­
ford Garden Club have been 
placed on Main Street. Al­
though the tops of the contain­
ers are planted with flowers, the 
lower section is for the purpose 
of keeping the streets clean, Mrs. 
J. W. Flores of the Garden Club, 
aid this week.

TERMITES
SWARMING?

T H E  S I M P L E  WA Y  
TO COOL YOUR HOME 
THIS SUM M ER! <

BRYANT “ADD-ON” GAS AIR CONDI­
TIONERS are ideal for home owners who 
already have gas heat because they can be 

simply added on to your present heating system. No costly new 
wiring to install!

pleasant temperatures all year.
BETTER HEALTH! Bryant GAS Air Conditioning removes air-borne 
dust and pollen for the relief of hay fever.
tmt̂ y p f n STVE to  INSTALL! Takes up little space — OUTSIDE the 
housf Ihe only one electrical connection, a single
gas connection and plastic pipes to the inside cooling coil. 
ECONOMICAL, TOO! Bryant GAS Air Conditioning cuts cooing 
costs up to 40%! ,
There’s a GAS Air Conditioning system for every home and business. 
F o flu ll  information and estimates call u s . . . n o  obligation, of course.

WESTERN 1

f f  SERVICE
COMPANY

When they measure you for 
clothes in Kentucky they always 
ask if you want one or two hip 
pockets and whether in pint or 
quart size.

Not just three sizes. . .  but three different kinds of cars. . .  Chevrolet!

Don’t  be as uncertain as the 
weather — use Star ads.

Introducing
^̂ CHIEF"

THE GRAIN BIN WITH ALL 
THE FEATURES

* Chief grain storage bins, 
bulk feed tanks, drying bins 
and feed meters.

* Wonder building farm, 
ranch or commercial build­
ings.

* Wonder building tornado, 
fallout shelters.

* Varco uniframe steel build­
ings for all needs.

“Build it better for less with 
THRIF-T-BUILT.”
Thrif-T-Built 

Steel Structures
1509 Grand Phone DB4-0185 

Amarillo, Texas

Chevrolet Impala Sport Sedan {foreground)

fflliiraUiiiiri iwiiii 
Chevy I I  Nova U-Door S^alipn Wagon Corvair Monza ^-Door Sedan {background)

Take your pick of 34 models during CHEVY’S GOLDEN SALES JUBHiEE
A

No look-alikes here! You’ve got three decidedly different 
kinds pf cars to choose from—each with its own size and 
sizzle. The Jet-smooth Chevrolet’s specialty is luxury— 
just about everything you’d expect from an expensive car, 
except the expense. ■  If you’re thinking a bit thriftier, 
there’s the Chevy II with practicality to do you proud.

Lots of liveliness, too, for such a4ow, low price. ■  Got 
a sporty gleam in your eye? StepMght up to our Coryair 
for rear-engine scamper and steering that’s doggone near 
effortless. Conclusion: See your Chevrolet dealer now 
for the most versatile choice going and a 
beauty of a buy on your favorite.

Beautiful Buying Days are h e r ^ ^  ------

Davis Motor Co.
North Second & Main Streets Stratford, Texas Phone 396-3191
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Mrs. Pronger 
Entertains 
Inter Se Club

]VIrs. A. E. Pronger entertain­
ed the Inter Se Club Friday af­
ternoon, May 18. Several games

of “42” were enjoyed and Mrs, 
Nellie Blanck won high score. 
Lovely refreshments were serv­
ed to Mesdames Nellie Blanck, 
S. J. Calvird, A. L. King, Sam 
Wohiford, C. W. Moon, I, D. Di­
vine, Earl Shirk, Joe Brown, 
Zelda Dunlap, Earl Biffe and W. 
O.’ Bryant.

I t Pays to read Star ads.

I WANT TO

THANK
My Friends and All Others 

Who Were So Kind 
And Voted For Me

In The Recent Primary Election

MRS. MADGE F. LOWE

Saturday Is 
National 
Poppy Day

Saturday, May 26, is National 
Poppy Day for 1962. It is the 
day when the American Legion 
Auxiliary members will try to 
get every one to wear a little 
red poppy.

The poppy Is the official me­
morial flower of the American 
Legion Auxiliary, and will be 
worn as a personal tribute' to 
the Nation’s War Dead.

The poppy is made of red 
crepe paper by disabled veter­
ans and is ready to bloom over 
every heart. Crippled hands 
have made the poppies carefully 
and jJainstakingly. Touch has 
guided the fingers of some pop­
py makers.

Let us keep in mind those 
well known words from Abra­
ham Lincoln’s address: “With 
malice toward none, with char­
ity for all, with firmness in the 
right as God gives us to see the

IS

WITH A 
READY-LITE*

ASK YOUR  
PUBLIC SERVICE

ñ e Íg h b o r

SO U T H W E ST C R fipuBuc siav/ce
c  o  M P A N V; > .

27-7

(x  H A V a~ A  p r o b l g k A
WvOTHET?. ,--------^

X -rflINK X'AA INI
LOVE WITH TWO 

L BOYS.

SO^^E PROBLE/AÎ 
fAOST 61RLS 
WOULD BE HAPPY 
WITH JUST OHE 

BOY

BUT... 
THE 

PRCBLEW 
IS...

right, let us strive to finish the 
work, to care for him who shall 
have borne the battle and for 
his widow and orphan — to do 
all which may achieve and 
cherish a just and lasting peace 
among ourselves and with all 
nations”.

Wearing a poppy tells the 
w o r l d  t h a t  w e  
remember and are grateful to 
those who made it possible for 
us to live in America.

Buy and wear a poppy Satur­
day.

Mrs. Dovel 
Entertains 
Truth Seekers

The Truth Seekers Sunday 
School Class of the First Chris­
tian Church met at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Dovel for 
a yard party. A wiener roast, 
ice cream, cake and pie were en­
joyed by aU.

Later the group went indoors 
where games were played.

Those attending were: Rev. 
and Mrs. H. Cecil Bever, Mr. and 
Mrs. Gail McDaniel, John and 
Whit, Mr. and Mrs. Dean Gif­
ford, Mike and Mark, Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Dietrich and Patty, 
Mr. and Mrs. Dale Schriiber and 
Jack, Mr. and Mrs. Harold Bak­
er, Joe Mack Hill, Mrs. Sam R. 
Lasley and Shelly, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bernard Dovel and Mr. and Mrs. 
Byron Tyler.

Luck’s biggest letter is U!

You May Be 
A Winner

We have the list of WINNERS in the
FIRESTONE ^500,000 PRIZE CONTEST
come in and check YOUR COUPON . . . 
REMEMBER you may win a new car TOO 
. . .  but you must bring in your coupon!

Gulf Super Service

Food Topics
Instead of drinking orange juice 

for breakfast every morning, try 
for variety by spooning frozen 
concentrated orange juice over 
fruit cocktail for a treat.

For a refreshing tomato juice 
cocktail heat tomato juice with 
instant minced onion and slices 
of lemon. ChUl and serve with 
chopped ripe olives, with minced 
parsley sprinkled on top.

Add a bit of garlic salt to 
melted butter in which you pan­
toast bread cubes for soups or 
salads.

Helen’s Favorite:
Fruit Slaw Mold 

(Serves 6)
Vz cup fresh dates, cut 
1 3-ounce package lemon 

gelatin
1 cup boiling water 
% cup cold water
1 tablespoon lemon juice

teaspoon salt
2 teaspoons crushed tarragon 
1 cup shredded cabbage
1 cup grapefruit sections 
Vt teaspoon celery seed 

Dissolve gelatin in boiling 
water; add cold water, lemon 
juice, salt and tarragon. Chill 
until thickened. Add all re­
maining ingredients. Chill in 
IrqnarL mold until firm. Un­
mold .̂and serve on salad 
gnMUSTs.

R E A D Y - L I T E  K N O W S  [DAY| FROM NIG.HT!

Caim^ cling peaches can be 
filled with tartar sauce to serve 
as an accompaniment to fish 
platters

For a luncheon salad blend to­
gether deviled ham, chopped 
hard-cooked eggs, celery and 
pickle relish with enough mayon­
naise to hold together and serve 
in fruit cups.

Maraschino cherry juice is ex­
cellent for sweetening and color­
ing grapefruit halves for dessert. 
Add a spoonful of slivered, 
toasted almonds for flavor con­
trast.

Our Brand New Line
OF

DAYTON TIRES
At Low Low Prices

“ DAYTON FLYER 99

White Tubeless “ NYLON” Black Tubeless
7.50-14 $20.14 7.50-14 . $17.23
8.00-14 $22.21 8.00-14 . $18.79
6.70-15 $20.14 6.70-15 $17.23
7.10-15 $22.13 7.10-15 $18.71
7.60-15 $24.05 7.60-15 $20.29

“ INTERURBAN— MUD & SNOW”
Black Tubeless “NYLON” Black Tube Type
6.70-15.......................$21.78 6.70-15 $19.31
7.10-15.......................$23.59 7.10-15   $21.15
7.60-15 $25.82 7.60-15 $23.01
8.00-14 $23.67
7.50-14 $21.69

“ DAYTON PREMIUM NYLON” 
White T ubeless Black T ubeless

7.50- 14 __  $25.27
8.00-14 $27.55
8.50- 14 $30.16
9.50- 14 $33.33

7.50- 1 4 ................... $22.39
8.00-14 $24.43
8.50- 14 $26.70
9.50- 14 $25.52

All Passenger Car Tires Are Unconditionally 
Guaranteed Against ALL ROAD HAZARDS 
F R E E  —  Wheel Balance F R E E
Prices in this ad include all Tax except State Sales Tax

TRACTOR TIRES -  REAR -  NYLON
18.4-34 -  15 X 34 ............................................. 6 Ply $137.18
13.6- 38 -  12 X 38 4 Ply $ 86.58
13.6- 38 -  12 X 38 6 Ply $101.21

see; u s  f o r  y o u r  b e s t  t ir e  b u y

Cotney Chevron Station
DARRELL COTNEY, Mgr. Phone 396-3351 |
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FOR AND ABOUT TEENAGERS

More About
By C. D. Smith

Thirteen-Year-Old 'Steadies’

THE WEEK’S LETTER: “I
have read yoxir replies about girls 
that are thirteen being too young 
to go steady. I agree with you 
that a girl should not lose inter­
est in her studies because of a 
boy. I am thirteen myself, but I 
do disagree with you that thirteen 
is too young to go steady. I am 
going with a boy who is fifteen. 
He comes up to the house on 
weekends. My parents get mad 
when he is there, but when the

family is together they will joke 
about it. Why? And why do you 
think thirteen is too young? Isn’t 
it better to be with a boy who is 
nice and around your own age 
than to be with any fellow who 
comes along, old or young? Of 
course, I don’t do that. I was 
only trying to make my point. 
Will you answer my questions? 
Why shouldn’t girls of 13 show 
interest in boys?

OUR ANSWERS: We agree

with you when you agree with us 
that a girl should not neglect her 
studies for a boy . . .  or vice 
versa.

Even if you disagree, thirteen 
is too young to go steady.

You do not go steady. You are 
permitted to allow a boy to come 
to your home to see you. Your 
parents would permit other nice 
boys to visit, too.

Your parents do not get mad 
because he is there. In our hum­
ble opinion they act with re­
straint because they don’t want 
to encourage the lad to the ex­
tent he may want to come every 
day of the week as weU as on 
weekends.

Would you prefer your parents 
“joked” about it, “fussed” about 
it—or said nothing at all?

Girls of thirteen should rightly 
show an interest in boys—and we 
emphasize the ”s” in boys. It re­
fers to the boys a girl meets at 
school, church and other prop­
erly chaperonned functions.

If you h a v e  a t e e n a g e  prob’em  you  
vs^ant to d i s cu ss ,  or an o b se rv a t io n  to 
m a k e ,  a d d r e s s  your le t ter  to F O R  
A ND  A BO U T T E E N A G E R S .  N A T I O N ­
AL W E E K L Y  N E W S P A P E R  S E R V ­
ICE. F R A N K F O R T .  KY

NOW IS THE TIME TO

GET WINTER OUT OF 

YOUR CAR

Our Spring Tune-Up
Will Give It Pep

New Spark Plugs and Points
Will Give It Power

DRIVE IN FOR A COMPLETE CHANGE OVER

T.O.C. Motor Co

hope I am not prosecuted for 
defending the children who 
idolize these teachers.

If a child does not come home 
from school, it is up to us par­
ents to find out where they are. 
I don’t think there is really a 
bad boy or girl, if each of us as 
parents would keep up with our 
duties. I don’t think that it is 
right for a child to go from one 
house to another and cause 
trouble for other people when 
they should be at home, 
sometimes we as parents 
selfish and think about 
selves and do not think 
the good of our children. There 
is plenty of time for good times 
after we fulfill our responsibil­
ities to our children.

When they are married and 
have their children, they will be 
proud of their parents. Remem­
ber, we were blessed by God with 
children. Some people do not 
have children, and wish they 
had them, so lets do a good job 
of caring for them.

Mrs. Ruben L. Villarreal

But
are

our-
atoout

L E T T E R  
To The Editor

Dear Editor:
I live in a little town called 

Stratford. I am a mother. I 
was raised to know when I was 
wrong. Well anyway it is about 
our school. Three of our best 
teachers quit. I want to know 
what was wrong.. The other 
mothers would not talk about it 
so I asked some of the school 
children. They said it was be­
cause some of the boys drank 
and smoked, and the parents 
blamed the teachers for it.

I  told them it was not right, 
and told them to get together 
and talk and get it straightened 
out. They said there was 
nothing they could do. So I 
told them to remember that we 
lived in a free country and we 
should never forget that.

Everybody has a right to talk 
whether they be rich or poor. 
Some of the children do not 
want to go back to school on 
account of the three teachers 
who resigned. So I take the 
liberty to write about it. I

Altar Society 
Meets With 
Mrs. Everett

St. Joseph’s Altar Society and 
Confraternity of Christian 
Mothers met May 16 in the 
country home of Mrs. R. K. Ev­
erett Jr. Eleven members were 
present.

It was reported that the bake 
sale held May 12 was very suc­
cessful.

Mrs. Diller, Christian Moth­
er’s president, gave the monthly 
report for mothers saying they 
should ibe patient and mild to- 
viards their children.

A very informative program 
given by Mrs. Alvin Engelbrecht 
and Mrs. Rene Gunzelman, was 
taken from the encylical “Mater 
Et Magistra”.

New officers for the coming 
year were installed in a candle­
light ceremony following the 
business meeting.

Mrs. D. D. Dettle, the outgo­
ing president, was presented 
with a statue of St. Francis of 
Assissi in appreciation of her
year’s work. i

A social hour followed and pie

Golf Ladies 
Met Monday

The Women’s Golf Association 
met at the club house a t the 
golf course Monday morning. 
The hostesses, Bettye Lasley and 
Ruby Palmer, served coffee and 
doughnuts to the following la­
dies: Doris Parker, Darlene 
Smith, Viola Springfield, Reba 
Pittman, Peggy Jackson, Tom­
mie Garoutte, Irene Wakefield, 
Virgie Biddy, Alice Jeffcoat, 
Alda Mitts, Judy Oquin, Char­
lene Oquin, Marcella McBryde 
and Mary Lovett.

Several ladies signed to go to 
the Dumas tournament.

Reba Pittman won a golf ball 
on ladies day.

It was decided to buy two tra ­
veling trophies for the scotty 
tournaments. Numbers were 
drawn to play golf.

It was voted to meet at 8:30 
every Monday morning on ladies 
day to play instead of 10 
o’clock.

.25 Inch Of 
Rain In Two 
Showers

Rain totaling .25 of an inch 
fell in Stratford Wednesday and 
Thursday nights. The heaviest 
rains were reported to the 
northeast where as much as ah 
inch fell.

The moisture was spotted. 
Some fields received almost an 
inch while those in adjoining 
sections received only small a- 
mounts.

Bill Pendleton
Tour Home Town 

A U C T I O N E E R  
Box 406 -------- Stratford, Texas

and coffee were served by the 
hostess to Mrs. D. D. Dettle, 
Mrs. Ray Doerfler, Mrs. Charles 
Diller, Mrs. Alvin Engelbrecht, 
Mrs. Joe Engelbrecht, Mrs. Rene 
Gunzelman, Mrs. Teddy Irlbeck, 
Mrs. Phillip Miller, Mrs. Joe 
Walsh, and Mrs. Darrel Ryberg.

Want Your Cake and
Eat It Too?

IT IS ALL SO EASY WHEN YOU

See Cy Brown
FOR HIS SERVICES IN ASSISTING YOU IN SECURING A

New or Remodeled
HOME

When you invest in a new home you not only are pa3ong yourself 
for living in your own modem, beautiful, up-to-date home . . . .

You are building up an investment in your property worth actual 
cash, and readily salable.

When you build your own new home you can have your cake and 
eat it too -  modem comfortable livmg plus an investment as good as 
money in the bank. “

Brownbuilt Homes by Cy Brown

New Members Enrolled
On Sunday May 20, four new 

members were enrolled in the 
Confraternity of Christian 
Mothers. Father Kevin Hand 
was director of the reception 
ceremony. The new members 
were received into this organ­
ization after the regular Sunday 
Mass with benediction following. 
There are now 14 members en­
rolled.

The Confraternity of Chris­
tian Mothers in a unification of 
Catholic ladies, married or wi­
dowed, to assist each other to 
obtain Christian home educa­
tion of children by truly Chris 
tian mothers. The members 
are encouraged to undertake the 
important task of training and 
sanctifying the young souls en­
trusted in their care.

Father Bertin Roll, Cap., na 
tional director of Archconfrater­
nity of Christian Mothers, en­
rolled the first members of this 
parish a year ago in March. 
New members received Sunday 
were Mrs. Darrel Ryberg, Mrs. 
Buddy Miller, Mrs. Doug Det­
tle and Mrs. Rene Gunzelman.

BALANCING ACT . . .  Lois Pii- 
sen trains to be a cocktail wait­
ress at the University Key Club 
in Fort Lauderdale, Fla. The 
club is exclusively for college 
alumni.

Many a man has never mar­
ried because he doesn’t believe 
in divorce.

LONG TERM LOW COST 
LAND LOANS FOR:
Irrigation Systems 

Improvements 
Land or Cattle Purchases 

Operating Expense 
Refinancing etc.

FEDERAL LAND BANK 
ASS’N. OF DALHART 

Dalhart, Texas

An old mountaineer once told 
us he had been shaving himself 
with a straight-edge “for nigh 
on to five years, and I ain’t  cut 
myself neither time.”

fh is 
>/ pattem i
A  ^ »Y AUDREY UNE

week’s! 
tern:

SY AUDREY UNE

For Your Prettiest Print

3240Í4̂ -24Ü
Cabana Set

The Public Is Cordially Invited To Look Through 
'The Homes We Build While They Are 
Under Construction. Phone 396-5101 STRATFORD

Dr0 ss Pattern  No. 3240. For Your 
Prettiest Print. W hat cou ld  b e  m ore bo- 
com ing than th is so ftly  d ra p ed  su rp lice  
with the slim sk irt in side-clo sing  e ffect?  
N o. 3240  come« in s iz e s  14’/*, I 6 '/ i ,  
ja V i, 20 '/2 , 22>/2, 24»/i. S ize  16V i takes 
3̂ /a yards o f 39-inch fa b r ic .

N eed lew ork  Pattern N o . 734 . Cabana  
Set. This darling  little cabana se t is 
inexpensive  and sim ple to m ake fo r  the 
little 2-year-old boy . Pattern N o. 734  
contains cutting pattern and instructions.

Sen d  35c fo r each d ress pattern , 25c 
fo r each need lew ork pattern (add  5c fo r 
each pattern fo r th ird  class m ailing and  
10c fo r each pattern fo r first class m ail­
ing) to AUDREY.. LAN E BUREAU, BOX 
1490, N ew York 1, N .Y .

Weed Spraying
$1.35 to $1.50 an acre

Save Moisture in Your Wheat and 
Pasture Land.

Satisfaction Guaranteed
INGRAM FLYING SERVICE

Business Phone 384-2400
Residence Phones 249-2193 or 249-2446
Dalhart -------- Texas

Or LocaUy, You May Call Farmer’s Supply, Phone 396-3311

R I C H A R D S O N
S E E D  F A R M S

Dryland 202R and 

303R Irrigation 

HYBRID SORGHUM

Seeds
$16.00 per Hundred

Developed And Improved by Continuous Research

Farmer’s Supply
KEEP YO U R HOME UP TO

QUALITY ALUMINUM 
or

RIGID VINYL
Summer sun on unshaded 
windows can increase room 
temperatures by as much as 
12 degrees inside your home. 
With NAVA CO Ventilated 
Awnings, you not only enjoy 
a cooler home, but also a more 
beautiful home. And they’re 
built to last!
•  A style for every home 

and window
• Ventilated to eliminate 

fiot air pockets —  yet 
afford maximum shade

Send For Free Literature

NAME.

ADDRESS.

CITY- STATE.

Free I n s t a l l a t i o n  w i t h  Order of §125.00 or more.

Horne & Sons Builders & Supply
Dalhart, Texas 901 Chicago St. Phone 249-430
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Miss Baskin 
Is Honored 
With Shower

The lovely home of Mrs. G. 
L. Taylor was the scene for a 
bridal shower Saturday honor­
ing Carolee Baskin, bride-elect 
of Wayne Dean of Canyon.

Mrs. Baskin Brown registered 
the guests. Molly Davis and 
Ann Burgess presided at the 
serving table.

The table, featuring the brides 
chosen colors of green and 
white, was covered with a lace 
cloth over green taffeta and 
centered with an arrangement 
of white peonies and mock or­
ange blossoms, flanked by white 
tapers in silver candelabra. The 
table appointments were of sil­
ver and the colors were also 
carried out in the referesh- 
ments of punch and cakes.

Carolee and her sister, Mrs. 
Glenn Hart, and her aunts, Mrs.

Carolee Baskin

Joe Brown and Mrs. T. F. Bas­
kin, wore corsages of green car­
nations.

The honoree received many 
lovely and useful gifts during 
the afternoon and was assisted 
by her sister, Mrs. Glenn Hart,

The Sewing Center 
And Saw Shop

Dress Making or Alterations
SEWING OF ALL KINDS

Saws Sharpened, Retoothed 
and Repaired

Let Us Sharpen Your Saws 
the Foley Way

Gladys and Earl Kirkwood
In the Slay Building 

Phone 396-5361

Meet a fellow Texan: Preston Smith.
Preston Smith’s story is in the best Texas and Ameri­

can tradition— a farm boy who worked his own way to 
an education and a place of honor in his business and 
community life.

Born in the heart of Texas, at Georgetown, he moved 
with his family to Dawson County in 1923 when he was 
10 years old. He went to school at Sunset, Lamesa, and 
Texas Tech. In his adopted home town of Lubbock, with 
his wife Ima and their two children, he now carries out 
the full responsibilities of a typical Texas business and 
civic leader.

A steward' at St. John’s Methodist Church— member 
of the Salvation Army Board, the KIwanis Club, the 
Chamber of Commerce, the Texas Farm Bureau— these 
are some of the activities close to "ttie heart of Preston 
Smith, citizen.

He did not stop there. In his daily pursuits Preston. 
Smith came to realize that business and government 
are closely related in the American system— and that 
without good government we cannot have a favorable 
climate for good business. A man of direct action, 
Preston Smith went into the business of government. 
He served six years in the Texas House of Representa­
tives and six in the Senate.

Senator Smith has supported sound statewide legisla­
tion for better schools, roads, welfare and conservation. 
He took the lead in establishing a permanent building 
program for state colleges. He had the integrity to sup­
port necessary state spending and the courage to op­
pose extravagance and waste. In government, as in 
business and at home, Preston Smith believes in meet­
ing our obligations and paying our bills.

Having proved himself as one of the best-rounded, 
best-equipped, best-informed and most highly respected 
Texans in both his private and public careers, Preston 
Smith was a logical candidate to succeed Ben Ramsey 
as Lieutenant Governor of Texas.

Voters in 102 counties gave Preston the lead over 
four opponents in the First Democratic Primary. Now he 
is in the runoff. He got there without the support of 
any self-serving group or power bloc. His opponent has 
the endorsement of labor leaders and other special 
interests who want to dominate our state government.

Preston Smith asks only for the votes of individual 
Texans who want a Lieutenant Governor without any 
strings attached. He is depending on independent-mind­
ed Texans everywhere to vote for him on June 2.

Elect your independent candidate for Lieutenant 
Governor—

THOUGHT FOR MEMORIAL DAY
TIWE YEAISS rOLLOWIlMfe VfegLP W AI 1 ,  

W i LCA\iglNi£0) TIUIÄTWE MlUiTAfSyyE 
W@^LD ISEtPOMSJBJLIlTIlES 
©P PEPISH ©FF TOE. ÊÂiSTM,

AMD THAT W WE WEMT D@WM 
THE COMCEPT OF FBEEDú M 

©M WHICH C1V1LIZÂTIÛM IM THE W EST WAS MILT 
W@ULE) SO DOVArN WITH US !

WE LEÂB1MED THAT F©S A PEOPLE,AS F©i A 
THE B0ÂD TO CBEÂTNE

After a woman has had the 
last word she is just dying to

know what her 
thinking atoout.

husband is

Bring Your Automotive Problems To Us

Trained Mechanic
With 22 Years Of Experience 

On Duty At All Hours
YOUR PATRONAGE IS APPRECIATED

QUALITY AUTOMOTIVE 
SERVICE

ON U. S. HIGHWAY 287 AT NORTH SECOND
Phone 396-5391 Dave Olson, Mgr,

in opening and listing them.
Hostesses for the occasion 

were: Mesdames G. L. Taylor, W. 
D. Green, L. S. DeBord, Wayne 
Harding, Bob Burgess, Clyde 
Pittman, Cone Donelson, Ever­
ett Riggs, Kenneth Kendrick, 
Lester Plunk and Ira D. Divine.

Phillip Bain 
Is Completing 
New Warehouse

Phillip Bain is having a 40x80 
foot warehouse built on South 
Chestnut Street. He hopes to 
have the building completed in 
about 10 days.

To Cure More -  
Give More

The American Cancer Society 
has added to its slogan, “fight 
cancer with a checkup and a 
check,” a new and meaningful 
phrase — “to cure more, give 
more.”

It has every reason to do so. 
Twenty-five years ago there 
were only 160,000 people alive 
cured of cancer. Today, there 
are a t least 1 ,100,000 alive and 
cured of cancer. And the fig­
ure is going up each year.

Twenty-five years ago, it was 
stated that one out of seven 
were being cured of cancer. To­
day, it is one out of three. And 
tomorrow, if every one had an 
annual health checkup, it could 
be one out of two.

Today, some 87,000 Americans 
die needlessly of cancer each 
year. They are lost because 
they did not receive early diag­
nosis and prompt treatment.

The American Cancer Society 
says that the possibility of pre­
venting deaths from cancer are 
greater than for any other 
chronic disease and that more 
can be done against cancer than 
against any other disease.

That is why the Society de­
veloped the theme — “to cure 
more, give more.” The public 
must learn what it can do to 
protect itself against cancer.

This requires a  big and costly 
educational effort. Statistics 
show that about 40 per cent of 
the population of the country 
do not know cancer’s seven dan­
ger signals — signals that may 
mean the difference between 
life and death.

Also the Society wants to step 
up its research'program. Al­
ready a drug has been found ef­
fective against one very rare 
type of cancer. The Society has 
great hope that in the next few 
years much can be achieved in 
the field of immunology — pre­
vention of cancer through vac­
cination. Until research sup­
plies the answer, we cannot hope 
to save more than one out of 
two of those who develop can­
cer.

As President Kennedy’s Con­
ference on Heart Disease and 
Cancer said, “this is no time to 
sit stiU on research.” A good 
way to advance research is to 
heed the Society’s 19G2 theme — 
“to cure more, give more.”

ABSTRACTS
WE HAVE A COMPLETE 

ABSTRACT PLANT
Covering All Real Estate In 

Sherman County
We Furnish Quick Efficient Service 

On Short Notice

Sherman County Abstract Co.
Royal Pendleton, Manager Stratford, Tezaa

PUBLIC SALE
We will sell the following described Farm Machinery to the highest bidder for 

cash, at the Sam R. Lasley farm, located 15 miles East of Stratford on the Gruver 

Highway; or 19 miles North and 1 mile East of Sunray, beginning promptly at —

1:00 P. M.

Monday May 28
C O M B I N E S

1—IHC 1954 141 Combine with Cab.
1—IHC 1953 27 Combine with Cab.
1—John Deere 1957 Model 55 

Combine.

T R U C K S
1—1953 Dodge Truck, 2-ton, with 

Grain Bed.
1—1947 I 2  Ton Chevrolet Truck, 

with Grain Bed.
1—1944 2J Ton GMC Truck, Grain 

Bed, New Motor.
1—1947 I 2  Ton Ford Truck with 

Grain Bed and Hoist.
1—1952 Model Dodge (4 by 4)

Power Wagon.

D R I L L S
1—Set of 3 16x10 Van Brunt Grain 

Drills, high wheels, rubber tires.
1—Set of 2 16x10 Van Brunt high 

wheel Grain Drills.
1—26 Foot Wing Type Hoeme Chisel.
1—IHC 7 Foot Mounted Mower.

T R A C T O R S
l-IHC WD-9 Tractor.
l-M&M GB Tractor.
1—IHC TD-9 Tractor and Dozer.

P L O W S
1-10 Foot M&M Oneway Plow.
1—John Deere Two Bottom 16 Inch 

Rollover Plow, 1957.
1—IHC Two Bottom 16 Inch Roll­

over Plow, Fast Hitch.
1—IHC 5 Disc Breaking Plow.

1—Air Compressor.
1—IHC (3 to 5) Engine and Pump 

Jack.
1—Lincoln Welder.
1—David Bradley Power Cattle 

Sprayer with Motor.
1—Wetmore Feed Grinder with 

Motor.
1— Model 329 Eversman Leveller.
2— John Deere Rod Weeders.
1—30-Foot 7-Inch Grain Loader.

Roy Whorton, Auctioneer Harold Oquin, Clerk

Lasley Bros., Craig & Powell, Owners
(Not responsible for accidents at the scene of the Sale)
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Town Talk

Mrs. Eunice Buster left .^un- 
iday ior a visit in thè home of 
Sir. and Mrs, Raymond Kirk­
wood in Alamorgordo, New Mex­
ico. She will also visit in the 
hiome of Mr. and MrS; John 
Kirkwood in El Paso,

Motor Co. while BoJney is awí^..

Mrs, C, W, Wells and son, and 
Mrs. Harold Baker and childr:en 
are attending th^ World’s Riir 
in Seattle, Washington,

Mr. and Mrs, F, L, Yates and 
Miss Evelyn Cooper visited rela­
tives in TeJchoma Sunday night.

Mr, >and Mrs, A. N, Slay and 
children of O akl^d , Califomla, 
left Monday after a week’s visit 
in the home of Mrs. Dorothy B. 
Slay and son, FTed. ^

Mrs. Charles Durr and Mrs. 
Newton Crabtree attended an 
area arts foundation meeting in 
Amarillo Saturday night, ,

Mr. and Mrs. Ted , Reynolds 
returned home Friday . |rom  
"Truth or Consequences, 'New 
Mexico, where they spent two 
weeks t a ^ g  treatments 
mineral ariiS ^ s o  .enjpyed
lish ir^  aipd to tin g . ' , , ,

îito. ¡and Mrs. Williams
wisited Royal Pe)i|PL||l;on in the;

Mrs. Lelah Boney and Miss 
Pauline Jones were week end 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Fred 
Childers of Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. J. D. McDaniel 
attended the Eighth Grade 
graduating exercises in Boise 
City Monday night. Their 
granddaughter, Karen McDan­
iel, was one of the 43 gra<hiates.

Mr. and Mrs. Newton Crabtree 
Visited Royal Pendleton Sunday 
in Dumas.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Malone and 
Connie visited in the homo of

Moore Oiunty M ^ ó r t tó ^ .M  George S toni to
8j to Punies nigh|., : — ;_Amarillo over the week end,

Jim Brown, Panhandle, visits 
€d with relativfs and friends 
j^ratford Monday.

T D. McDaniel returned Fri­
day night Ì:QP- ^  fish­
ing trip at Port Aransà^, T^^as, 
liaving won the trip from Tex­
aco Inc, for showing the greatest 

“ÌScréàsè oh sales over 41 bulk 
stations in the contest. Bob.

sisted iR.tiie m m  th% bulk 
ìùànt brother was a-r

Mr', and Mrs. Earl Kirkwood 
visited in the home of Aquilla 
Triplett and dsugliter, Mrs. 
Anna Seotij in Amariliv

NOTICE OF THE NAMES OF PERSONS

Ài/

This nptiot'ijbs given and published pursuant, to Seetioai 3., Article 327^, R. C, ,S. 1925, as enacted by the Third Called Session, §7th D ^islature o t  the State of Texas, 
than  seven‘If?) years. The depository named above does not know tkhe whereabouts of the depositors dr owners listed below.
The amounlgg ddue the depositors or, owners listed herein wM be, paid .mon proof of ownership a t the office of the  depository named aboye^^^^^^^ aiiKiunt not elain 
Be^vspaper for ithis advertisement "does not exceed the rate fear leg^f noBce publim^ fixed in Axticie 2^̂  ofvTexas 1925yuas:amended,i and ih e  am o]^ so i

Mrs. Shirley Ehgle has acceptr 
ed a  position as a cashier-book- 
k e ^ r  with Southwestern Pub- 
Jre Service Co,

Jack Dolney is spending his 
vacation with relatives in Min­
nesota. Ernest Kelp has ac­
cepted a position with T.,Q.lC|.

Clolf Ladies
I

Wifi in Dttiiiai ̂
Tournament

Sixteen Stratford laidies play­
ed in the golf tournament in 
Dumas Thursday of last week.

Tommie Garoutte won third 
in “A” flight by a play-off for 
second place. Peggy Jackson 
won second in “B” flight. Mo- 
zelle Tillery won first in “C” 
flight. Mildred Gore won 
second in “C” flight, and Doris 
Parker won third in “C”», flight.

I NS T A L L  A NEW

Cooling Unit
May be added to hèating 

system or installed as  ̂a 
new complete unitii

i'if

The Heatwave 
Heating Unit

Supplies comfortable 
automatic controlled- heat­
ing of your home during 
the winter months. '

Cooling and 

Heating Unit

for the ,

Year-Around,
>•

A • . ; ' i

Conditionmg

a n d

Automatic

Heating

Of Your Home

Beall’s
Refrigeration Service

RUSSELL BEALL Phone 396-5121

JNiaineijiOf. Depositors

Acre, Thos.
Adams, M. J. Mrs.
Alexander, J. A. >
Alexander, Will 
Allen, Frank 
Anderson, C. L.
Arentz, Starky 
Arnold, Chas.
Atchly, Ralph
Athey, Wilham H. & Etta
Baker, Grover C. & Deck,

George W. |
Baker, Joe H.,̂  , ~ L
BaU, B. W. I
Barnes & Harrison, Messrs. 
J^tpn,.-F)re4-v \
Beauchamp, Howard 
Beedy, W.'..K. . - . i t . . ,•
Benwell, J, S. 1 \
Beriy, Arnold
Bingham Rippij^g Vat
Bivins, Richard 
Blanke, A1 
Bplton, A. D,
JBpon#, Mr. and Mrs, W. O., Jr. 
Bo§iick, Joe W.
Boston, Clyde 
Bower, i ,  E.

Clara Mrs., Personal
Bozalis, John
Bradley, Wm. T, _
Bragg, Mrs. W. M, ,
Briggs, C, P,
Britton, Cart 
Brown, Grady 
Brown, Oscar 
Brown, Mrs, Irene 
Brown, Mrs, Lola 
Brown, Wayne 
Brownie Scouts 
Bryson, E. R. & Mafy 
Buchett Brothers 
Bugner, Joe 
Bull, S. A.
Bunch, Floyd 
Burke, Webster H.
Burks, Richard 
Burroughs, Mrs. Harriett ,j
Burt, Mrs. Ĝ  ̂ D. r
Bush, H. H. "
Butler, Thomas W., ^
C. & W. Distributing Co.
Calwell, Clarence 3 *Campbell, Thomas '
Carmihael, Mrs. Evelyn 
Carpenter, E. E.
Carter, Ethel 
Chatauqua Fund 
Christian, C. H.
Cimarron Dairy 
Clary, Mrs. A. L.
Clary, Mrs. J. R. ’
Clifton, Annie C.
Cluck, Clifford
Cocky, The Heirs of William B., 

Dec’d.-'-̂  !|
Colberson, C. W. I
Coldwater School 
Collins, C. V., Sec. & Treas. 
Cone, Herbert 
Cooke, F. W.
Cook, John A.
Corbell, George Jr.
Corbitt, V. T.
Corn. W. L.
Cox, Donald 
Cox, Miss Mildred 
Craig, Lillian W.
Craig, William Hay 
Crawley, George W.
Crenshaw, Mrs. Betty Eubank 
Crowsom and Branch 
Crumley, Herbert 
Danner, W. H.
Darnell, Rex S.
Davidson Bros.
Davis, Denver 
Davis, J. W.
Dawson, J  .W.
Debner, Mrs. Ethel Louise 
Dees Ref. & Appliance Margin 

Acet.
DeJamett, A. >
Dickinson, T. M.
Dinwiddie, O. D.
Dipping Vat, J. H. Blackwell 

Tfeas.
Dodson, Mrs. Zoe Nell 
Dortch, Doyle 
Dortch, Jack 
Doxey, P-"’S.
Drumgoole, H. E.
Durr, Hugh 
Easttom, Jay 
Edgerman, A. L.
Edwards and Scott 
Eichelberger, MrsJ'Gertie 
ElkinsT C. •'

LAST.KNCm
Route, Box No.. No. & St. |  ̂ City ;amd State

Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown '
Unknown,
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown ;
Unknown i ^,
Unknown ¡I 
Unknown ' <* ■ -
Unknown 
Unknown „ - 
Unknown 
Unknown ;,
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown '

* — '^Ttrri 
UXl&XAVrv« M.
Unknown J
Unknown-
Unktsown
U nkn^n-
Unknowffl
Unknown | :
Unknown
Unknown
Unkimwh , , .

Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Dumas Ave.
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

Unknown '
Unknown ^
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown -
Unknown
Philrich Br. Box 2391
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

Unknown
Unknown
Ur^nown
Unknown

Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown ’'
Unknown

SlÿcMiord,
Stratford,
Strat/oixi,
Stratford,
Stratford,
Stratford,
Unknown
Stratford,
Stratford,
Unknown

Texas
Texas
Texas
Texas
Texas
Texas

Texas
Texaá

i

Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Stratford, Texas 
Stratford, Texas 
Stratford, Texas 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Stratford, Texas 
Stratford, Texas 
Gruver, Texas 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown' ? 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Stratford, Texas 
Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknowri 
U nknO ^ 
t in k n o ^
Untoown 
Unknown 
Unknown 
’Unknown 
Unknowiij,
Unknown
Texhoma, Oklahoma
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Dtimas, Texas.
Unknown
Unknown (
Unknown >
’Unknown
'Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown-
Unknown'
Unknown 
Unknown ; 
Unknown 
Unknown

Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Borger, Texas
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

Stratford, Texas 
’Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown

Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Stratford, Texas
Uhknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown

I
- »Ï■- J i

t :r-j- 
; vX̂'O :.T

'D'cvB

f
Names of Missings DepcNsitbrs

Escrow Account ?
Eslinger, Amos 
Euper, Wayne - >
Evans, J. F.
Dickevans, W. E.
Fanchar, J. W. G.
Fredric, R. M.
Felkner, Miss Priscilla 
Fellars, Â
Fidelity Bldg. Loan 
“54” Gas and Appliance 
Fike, W. L.  ̂ ;
^Fleming, Joe B- or Mrs. Evelyn
Fletcher, W. N. ■
Flyr, F. B. ..
Forsage, Ernest Wi :: I
Fourth July: Picnic 
Fowlkes, J. A. X
Foxworth, John Fred 
Freeman, Dan B.;>;
Freeman, G. G; - X
Fuqua^ Mrs. A1 Lee.,
Gaddy, W: F.
GaIloway,„R, V.
Gambel and Kensley, Messrs. 
Garcia^ Frank
Garner, John L. "
George, Clifford 
Gibbins, Arthur W.
Gibson, Mr. or Mrs. James
Gilmore, Lon
G|rl Scout Troupe 3
Glover, i .̂ iJt ' | |
Goddard, R. A. " , if
Gore, Howard 
Grabeal, Grace '
Gray, Vlfgil " ' ^
Green, Dudley .
Griffin, W. H. H, |
Griggs, W. A.
Hafer, Glenn, Sudan Acet. ■ 
Hanks, Benny |
Hansen, Mr. or Mrs. P. W. 
Harbour, L. M.
Harrington, R. E.
Harrison, C. I.
Harvester S. S. Class 
Harvey, E. H. >
Haynes.-'S.'‘G.''-.
Heald, John ^
Hewitt, J. R.
Hig^dns, W. A. ^
Hinds, Roy C.
Hiner, Alvin L. YN3 
Hoefligger, Robert 
Holt, Guy E.
Home Demonstration Market­

ing Fund
Home Economics Class 
Hoover, Mrs. Lou ..
Hough,.T. R. If
Hudson, I. N. " ^ " ;
Humble, Harry : 5
Hunt, Harry M. ~ t |
Hutsinger, O. M. ?
Huntsii^er House Rent A. j  
Hurst, Lester, Jr. %
Husky, Roy |
Ingerton, W. H. . ; i  ?
Ingham, A. Y. » y • ’*
Ingle, J. S. ■ ■ I.! '■ : i ['j
James, Fannie Sue t
James, J. Wade '
James, Margaret i t  
Johnson, Ansel '  i
Johnson, Mary . A.
Jones, Mr. or Mrs. C|yd4 
Junior Class of ’45 
Keenan, Gene 
Keene, S. W.
Kelley, Miss Frankie Mac 
Kellogg Implement Co.
KeUy, J. B.
Kemper, Mrs. Opal 
Kenzellian Class 
Kerrick School Athletic Fund 
Kessie, R. E., Justice of Peace 
King, H. Gi > ' ;
Kirkpatrick, Mrs. CSrene 
Kirkwood, James R.
Kline, M. L.
Knight, Ada Bella 
Lamarr, Anna A.
Lane, E. E.
Langfbi^, Frank or Stella 
Lankford, J. F. *
Lanners, Deryl 
Lawson, Forest 
League Book Fund ;
Leal, Sgt. or Mrs. Archie 
Leatherman, True 
Leonard, Lawrence- t  
Leonard, W. L. ,  ̂ _
Ledbetter, Leo 
Leonard, W.'L.
Lewis, Minnie C.
Lanners, Calvin ;
Lanners, John t ? ’

LAST KNOW 
Route, Box No.« & St.

'Unkno-wn
’Unknown
‘Unknown
'Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Box 24
’Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Box 205
Box 207
UMRown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown v
Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unkno-wn
Unknown
'Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Unkno-wn
Unkno-wn
’Unknown

Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unkno-wn
'Unknown
'Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown ’ '
’Unknown " '
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
’Unknown
'Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
'Unknown
'Unkno-wn
’Unknown
’Unknown
811 Alabama
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unknown
Route 2
U hkriti^
UnkhdWn
’Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
’unknown
’UnkiidWn
UnkhoWn
‘Unknown
’Unknown
tJiiknOWn
Uhknown
Unknown
’Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

"'V

æ

- IT-?.'

:Xtx
act

 ̂ --r- -J
TTTF 9TATE OP TEXAS COUNTY OF SHERMAN * Before îne, tho undersigned authority, on this day personally appeared O. H. OQUI.

• l . ^ ^ a t  he is Vice-President & Cashier of The First State Bank of Stratford, Stratford, Tex^, Dep^itory n ^ e d  in the a^^ been* held for ir
2. That the foregoing is a  full and complete list of the names of all dfepositors ahd-creditors for whom dormant deposits or inactive accounts have been held lor ir
3. That such listed depositors and creditors have not asserted any claim or exercised any act of ownership with respect to their deposits or accounts during; thb 'pa

Sworn to and subscribed before me this tiie 24 day of May, 1962. (Seal) NYNVLA MILLS, Notary Public, Sherman County, Texas.
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APPEARING AS THE OWNERS OF UNCLAIMED AMOUNTS HELD BY:

[ Of Stratford, Stratford, Texas
/ effective May 3*, 1962. ■ Tliis information iS'given in an effort to liDcate persons whc) are the depositors or (jwners of amotrnts in .accounts that h^ve remained inactive or dormant according to the provisions of Article 3272b for^niore

led within’ nine. <9) months of the daterof this publication'may be subject to report;to and conservation by* the State Treasurer in accordatice with Article 3272b; Titled 53, Revised CiviTStatutes of Texas. Thl'^amouM changed by the 
)aid may toe chiairged equally against i^e accounts owing to the persons ̂ Vrhose n a n ^ sa re  published. . ' _ ' ' '  ‘ ' ' ' _ L '  ‘ . - ' .

N ADDRESS '
City and State of Missing Depositors

LAST KN(P
Routé; Box No;, No. & St.

iVN a d d r essi City and Stiite ' Names of'T̂ ffesfarig Depositors
LAST KNOl

, Route; Box No.. No. & St.
VN ADDRESS '''■X. ' ■ . - -'i. *\ y.Ol '■si:

Cit.Y and State.i i
Cfnknown Lashley, R. W. - Unknown Dalhart, Texas ■ - Rogers, H. M. ’ Unknown « 'X v

■ ‘ -X brjO"“
Unknown

[Jnknown Lavake, Edwin “ > Unknown - Goodwell, Oklahoma Rogers, James Unknown Unknown
Stratford, Texas Leverton, O. C. Unknown Morse, Texas Rogers, Will “54” Cafe Route I Box 122 Gravitte, Arkansas •
Unknown .< Linsey, T. O. - Unknown Unknown Rosenburg, Mrs. Willie Unknown’ Stratford, Texas
Unknown . Lively, G. W. Unknown Stratford, Texas Ross and Garst  ̂ . Unknown Stratford, Texas
Unknown Lodwick, Albert L Unknown Unknown - - ' Ross, John W. Unknown - Unknown
Unknown Lovelace, Glen D. Unknown Colorado Springs, Colo. - / Rosson, Vergil Unknown Unknown " ' '
Stinnett, Texas ... , 
Uhkimwn —

Lovelady, B. F. 
Lowery, Nelson W. '

Unknown
Unknown

Stratford, Texas 
Unknown

Rural School Interscholastic 
League Fund Unknown * Unknown ' '̂

Jnknown : Lyle, Annie H. Unknown Unknown Rutherford, W. L. Unknown Unknown
unknown Mahaney, C. E.f-^^ Unknown Unknown Sanders, V* H. .Route! Edcouch, Texas
Jpknown Major, H. E. Unknown Dumas, Texas * " Scanlan, Gerald R. ^ 1609 N. Arapahoe Amarillo, Texas ' x̂ ' 1
Unknown ' fi- Mackie, Albert or Lbuiito r Box 662 " Spearman, Texas School Duster i . Unknown * Unknown
jnknown - r .i.. -; . Mann, RrA.'"'*' if Unknown f Unknown ' , School District No. 3 Special Unknown Stratford, Texas ' ' "
Unknown ij;.; ’ Manett, Samuel Est..* ^ Unknown Unknown , ‘ . .i .... . ' School Dist. No. 9  ̂  ̂ j';, Unknown Stratford, Texas
Unknown ; Marble, R. E» ' "i-  ̂ ^ Unknown Unknown  ̂ " Schultz, Malcom E;, Jr. * ' Unknown -• ■ ’ ‘ ‘' Uriknown '
Unknown Marki-Milton Unknown Unknown ' • Schowe, Lillian Olsen x Unknown Unknown " ' ' ''
Jnknown  ̂ . ;; Marshall, E. 1 Unknown Texhoma, Oklahoma ^ Schulz, R. W. " • ̂   ̂ X i Unknown Charming, Texasunknown Martin and BläckWelU, Messrs. Unknown  ̂ - ' Stratford, Texas Senior Class 1928 '  ̂ ' Unknown " ' ’ Stratforri, Texas , . .x 'unknown Martin, W.'T., Street Acct. • Unknown Stratford, Texas ’ " " ■ Senior Class 1933 ' • Unknown Stratford, Texas..
Unknown Mason, Ray " - Unknown Texhoma, Oklahoma Sheppard, Mrs. JiriT ^ Unknown Boise City,' Oklahoma ' ' ^
nnarillo, Texas Mathews, Carl Admin.' ^ Unknown - - Unknown • Sherman Co. Fair Fund Unknown - ■Stratford, Texas* - . '.v •-
Jiiknown Mathews, R. M. Unknown ' Unknown Sherman County Fair Assoc. Unknown Stratford, Texas
unknown Maxley, Ramou  ̂ z' Unknown Unknown ''' Sherman County Improve- X' - «■■■■’, 'i : . .
h toow n Meyers, Jimmie Unknown j Texhoma, Oklahoma ment Ass’n. Unknown ' Stratford, Texas ̂  ' "xx' |
Uiiknown Miles, Mrs. Wayne Unknown Unknown ‘ Sherman County Text Unknown -x ■Unknown Miley, Elvin Unknown Unknown - ' ' ' Book Fund Unknown. Stratford, Texas
Unknown 
¡Upray, Texas

MUey, Verl D. - 
Miller, E. B. ^

Unknown
Unknown

Unknown ' '' 
Unknown .1, “ ’

Sherman Wheat Council 
■ Sherman County Young

Unknown
Xit

Stratford, Texas ' X' '
- > l .. 0- 9; 'i

•amesa, Texas
unknown
rtijknown

Miller, Jesse L. 
MiUs, J. C. 
Milton, R. M.

Unknown 
Unknown 
Unknown i '

Unknown " 
Unknown ; . . > 
Unknown i,

Demo. Club 
Sbewbert, V, M. 
Shirey, J, G.

Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

Stratford,. Texas x-; ¿ii i l : 
Unknown '  ̂ ‘ x-'̂  ̂ > 
Stratford, Texas '

unknown ^  j 
.fn^own

Miranda Bros. ’ . y 
Mitchell, F. M.

Unknown 
Unknow^ ,,

Unknown
Unknown ‘ -  ̂ . |

Shivers, Mrs. Lula 
Simmons, A. J.

Unknown
Unknown ' X. x x. .

Stratford, Texas - j 
Unknown r x

'h^OWn ■ Moiumby, J. D,
Monroe, Hurbert j  |

Unknown « Unknown i Singleton, S. P. Unknown Unknown . . . .
'’hknown Unknown Dalhart, Texas  ̂ : Skelly, Frances Unknown Unknown ' ' . 0 ,  x-X;-!:,.
uhiknown , Mooers, Clifford '1 Unknown ' Unknown i Sly, R. E. Unknown 4 Unknown ' “ ' v
ifajknown ‘*® Moore, G. R. Unknown Unknown . . . Shrauner, Ivi. R. Unknown ’ Unknown ■ ■'
Uhiknown Moore, Mrs. Jean Garoutte Unknown Stratford, Texas ' - ^ Sieiral, feiith & J. W, Unknown Unknown
Uhiknown 11 Moore, John Unknown Unknown ' r Simmons Brothers ' Unknown Unknown
Unknown 
titatford, Texas 
Uhiknown

Moulton, Elma 
Murdock School 
Murry, Jean K.

Unknown ' 
Unknown 
Unknown .

Unknown. . 0   ̂
Unknown * , 
Unknown

Simmons, Mi§. Mary E. 
Smith Hughes School Fund 
Smith, Alice

Unknown
Unknown
Unknown

Unknown
Unknown -x; S 
Unknown '

"Unknown
Unknown
Uhiknown
Unknown

Myers, R. C. 
Myers, Mrs. S. F. 
McAbee, L. K. 
McClellan, H. E.

Unknown 
Unknown u 
Unknown < 
Unknown i

Unknown j 
Unknown
Dalhart, Texas | 
Unknown

Smith, J. 0 .
Smith, Kenneth 
Smith, Mrs. Louie Dell, Com­

munity Survivor

Unknown • 
Unknown

Unknown

Unknown 
Eufula, Oklahoma

Unknown
Unknown McCIelldon, R. L. ! Unknown Unknown

Unknown
Smith, Llpyd Unknown " Unknown

Unsown
^hjknown ..»r  ̂ . . !

McCollister, Leonard >= ¡* Unknown ?. Smith, Morris Unknown * Unknown
McCormac, Orra G.  ̂ / j Unknown Unknown v iV-r? Smith, Odell Unknown ; / Unknown w .t* .

unjknown McCrory, F.' M. | Unknown Unknown - * Snock & Vincent Unknown Unknown
Unjknown J; • McGowan, Helen Meyer Unknown Unknown . . ̂  . Snyder, Everett Unknown Unknown
unknown - : McIntyre, E. C- Unknown Unknown • xj ■ Snyder, J. R. Unknown Stratford; Texas
Uhknown McLean, Josie Unknown Unknown . , Sparks, Litch Unknown Unknown
Uhjknown  ̂ . I McNutt, K. R. - Kellogg, Clem H’isk Bldg. Amarillo, Texas J . .. . . Spearman High School Unknown Spearman, Texas:
unknown . , McNutt, Mrs. Vivian Unknown Unknown ' . ' Sprecker, George Unknown Stratford, Texas

(tifatford, Texas ' „ . . .
McWhirter, Alwayne 
Nall, Mrs. Margie

Unknown
Unknown

Unknown ■ 5 .* ■ 
Unknown ..--i /  i

Spruell, Paula Joe 
Spurlock, R. A.

Unknown
Unknown

Stratford, Texas 
Unknown

tratford, Texas . ■ Naugle, Miss Laurine Unknown . Unknown j . Standard Land Co. Unknown Unknown
Uhiknown - j 
urpwell, Texas ... |

Naugley Robert Star Route r- ; : Sugar City, Colorado ,x v - Stanffer, Mrs, Ethel Unknown 4 -̂ Unknown
Neatherlin, Buddy Unknown Boise City, Oklahoma . Starker, B. A. Unknown *»**>»-■ « • - _- -^BKnown

Sipatford, Texas ,, ..-vt r, s * Newell, D. N. aembif&i | |  
Newby, F; W., PersoMii t

Route 1 .r ■ • • Vernon, Texas •. r -; Straker, J. A. Unknown Unknown
Uhiknown .- v. -̂ --,1 ! Unknown 0-. Unknown x . v ‘ Staten, Margaret Ann Unknown Unknown
Uhiknown Ninth Grietde Girls Unknown Stratford, Texas ; ' i Steel, R. W. Unknown Unknown i
feilhart, Texas ; * 
Ific^art, Texas « , — •. ' |

Nix, W. F. & Morgan, B. L. » Unknown Unknown Sterl, G. L. and Elizabeth Unknown Unknown
' Noblesf John Margin Account Unknown ■ > v - Sunray, Texas . ' Stevens, Elgin Unknown > Unknown

ttatford, Texas ,, ,.n j | Norton, Robert E. ii Unknown ' Unknown Stevens, Verlon Uriknown • U n k n o w n ' . 4.
U nkriovm '-rs?iW i?i4“ ii-?elxhama, Oklahoma h • Oakley, R. C. • > Unknown  ̂ .r Stratford, Texas Stevenson. N..A. Unknown

ihjmrillo, Texas i Oakley, Teddy * i ^ Unknown Stratford, Texas j Steward, Irene Unknown II'ejxhoma, Oklahoma -.;. t : Ogden, Miss Elsie :?v : I Unknown ' Unknown ,x' ' Stewart, Rose Mary Unknown
'fexhoma, Oklahoma i Osborne, John V.  ̂ . ¡U Unknown Unknown - Stokes, J. T. Unknown ! U n ^ c ^  9
i^errick, Texas ixAv., I Otelle, Nick Unknown Unknown : r Stowe, L. A, Unknown ,. . S tra^^ri, T e i» ; -
unknown Parmley, T. M. v. . ,t Unknown Unknown Stowers, Mr. or Mrs. C. T. Box-'Mj  i Texhoma, ■ q k l# ^ rr> " '  ''
Unknown ’ Patton, J. T. ‘ Unknown Unknown . • ' ■ Stratford AgrL Acc. Unknown StratfcMTd, r i x d k * x # ' ^ 4 ' X
hiknown -  „ i! Pemberton, Elmer “ Unknown Unknown i Stratford Bank Uriknown Unknown ’i
Uhiknown i yr-'-r'̂ J 1 Pender, R. Ci Unknown Unknown , Stratford Bank Day Unknown Stratford, " '''. j|
Unknown , v - i: Pigg & Hinds K Unknown Stratford, Texas Stratford Building Fund - ■ Unknown ■ Stratford, Texas ' ¡1
Ittatford, Texas Pincham, Mrs. Alice Unknown Unknown Stratford Cemetery Unknown Stratford, * Texas; | i 

Stratford; Texas 'lt]fetford, Texas ' Pitman, Lydie Unknown - Unknown . r :. Stratford Cub Pack No. 38 Unknown
unknown ,■ v.x-'/':U ^ Pleyer, Miss Stella Unknown Unknown j  ' Stratford Development Club 4 Unkiiown , X, . ^ Stratford, Texas ” !
Uriknown ; 'Pratt, George ' Unknown * Texhoma, Oklahoma ~ Stratford Elkeenes Unkriov^ri Stratford,, Texas U v
lorse, Texas w Presley and Williams ’4 Unknown Dalhart, Texas Stratford Girl Scouts Unknown Stratford, Texas, « x - i|
unknown ■.* Preston, A. L. « Unkfiown Unknown Stratford Home Dem. Club Unknown Stratford, Texas 1*!
jnarillo, Texas .; Pronger School Unknown Stratford, Texas . Stratford Jr. 4-H 4 Unknown Stratford, Texâ sr .
Urdmown • Pryor, E. E. Unknown Unknown Stratford Oil Co. , ' Unknown ' « f  i Stratford, ^¿xas. x
derrick, Texas - , . Pugh, R. W. Unknown Unknown , ^ Stratford Trading Co. . ’ x' Unknown Stratford, Texas: | x
tratford, Texas .> - .. Purdy, Thurman Unknown Stratford, Texas x . Stratford Truck Line Unknown Stratford, Texasi .or' ^
Unknown ' Railroad Com; ;* ‘ Unknown Unknown Straud (or Stroud), Sherrill Unknown Unknown ^
tratford, Texas " Ramon, Miss Amelia Unknown Stratford, Texas Stubblefield, Joe & Dwight ; Unknown-"' ■: - i.;  ̂ : 1 Unknown " ' -x / «i
tratford, Texas Ratliff, Edd Unknown Unknown . t Sue, J. D. 1 ¡a Unknown - -i Stratford, Texas ; ■'.% 

Stratford, Texas ;Uiiknown Ray, Robert J. t Unknown Unknown S. S. School Pic. . ; -tI Unknown
ialhart, Texas f  i  Rä^^ottd, !!. W., Margin Unknown Stratford, Texas . • S. S. Class ' ' Unknown Stratford, Texas ^
Unknown Record, Tom Unknown Dumas, Texas Sunray Methodist Church I Unknown Sunray, Texas ||
Unknown Rector, G. A. Unknown Unknown Sunray Enterprises Unknown Sunray, Texas '
Unknown Red Cross Chapter Unknown Stratford, Texas , Suttle, Robert . Unknown Unknown Ji i.;
Unknown Reeves, Mrs. Sarah E. Unknown Unknown Sutton, Raymond 1 Unknown Unknown x , 5
Unknown I Reinhold and Norton Unknown Dalhart, Texas Teegerstrom, Kenneth ^ Unknown ^ Stratford, Texas « H
Unknown iI Reinhold, M. M. Unknown Dalhart, Texas Terrell, Carolyn Unknown ■ ' i v"‘ Unknown ,
Unknown II Reynolds & Reinhold Unknown Dalhart, Texas Terrell, Jame^ D  ̂ - Unknown Unknown v.
tratford, Texas Reynolds, W. L. Unknown Unknown Terry, J. Unknown Stratford, Texas it
Unknown Rig & Reel Unknown . Unknown , Texas Weather Improvement
Unknown Rilinger, C. R. Unknown Unknown . . Corp. g = Unknown jiT Tr ’ ; E

Unknown ' ' 4
Unknown Roberts, G. C., Jr. Unknown Unknown Tharp, Miss Hattie 'a j Unknown Unknown g
Unknown Roberts, Harriet M. Unknown Unknown . . Thomas, Carl F., Jr. ^ Unknown Unknown
Unknown Roberts, Hugh Unknown Unknown . i Thompson and McNutt " ' r Unknown Morse, Texas "U■ *' i
Jnknown Roberts, N. D. Unknown . : ; ,h Unknown ......... , i Thompson, Charlie Unknown Unknown ' U
lunray, Texas Robinson, W. E. Unknown •. JU/ Unknown , - i ■ , U^ompson, J.< E. Unknown Unknown ..........r . i" ■
Junray, Texas . Rogers, H. C., Jr. Unknown Unknown . Thompson, Marshall - ^ Unknown Stinnett, Texas I?

AFFIDAVIT OF DEPOSITORY OFFICER i 4 ■ :-4 ‘i:"' 1!
N>‘Who after being by me duly sworn, deposes, says, and certifies as true the follxjwing: -;.y ■■'X---:,.' |4

lii
lore than seven (7) years and whose existence and whereabouts are unknown, to the Depository. .0 xaj .'-Xj i bna ij.i.rt
St seven (7) years. ri.’-, . . , ! .J J .. -VOX  ̂- "/¿Ii U. r- /gf : i'

O. H. OQUTN
I..«., X .. ..a.:,*

4; ]
. .. .. 1̂ 1 1u -fj jl '■

i 'i ' . _ _ _ 14■ ... BO t..-i-«. .-4,v i. r  A - i.̂
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Phyllis Farris 
Gets Letter 
From Space Man

Phyllis Rae Farris, 10-year old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jim W. 
Parris, was sufficiently interest­
ed in  the National Aeronautics 
and  Space Administration to 
write to the Mercury Astronaut 
lA- Col. John H. Glenn Jr. 
Piiyllis Farris is a student in the 
fim rth grade of the Stratford 
Blementary School.

Glenn’s reply follows:
“Thank you for your interest 

and  thoughtfulness in writing 
about the flight of the Friend­
ship 7 spacecraft.

Many things were learned

from this and from the earlier 
flights of Alan Shepherd and 
Gus Grissom. Each flight is a 
stepping-stone in our ever-ex­
panding manned space flight 
research program.

Project Mercury is a team ef­
fort of many, many thousands 
of people. Beyond those work­
ing directly on the project, how­
ever, the flight of Friendship 7 
had the support, thoughts and 
best wishes of many thousands, 
perhaps even millions of people 
throughout the world.

Again, I appreciate yom 
thoughtfulness in writing to 
me”.

What a salesman was the guy 
who talked his wife into being 
sorry for the girl who lost her 
hairpins in the back seat of his 
car.

f G U A R A N T E E D
Automotive Repair Service
Garage at 202 South Pearl Street

TELEPHONE 396-2261 
Bring Your Automotive Troubles To Me

GROVER B. HAMPTON

Want A d s
Wanted

WANTED: Sewing to do in my 
home. Will also cover buckles, 
make button holes and belts.
_Mrs. W. J. Lowe, Phone 396-
4381. 36-tfc

Special Services
ÜREE loan of our efficient 

CSarpet Shampooers with pur­
g a s e  of Blue Lustre Shampoo. 
— McMahen Furniture Co.

22-tfc
NOTICE: For all of your Me­

morial work; slabs, curbing, 
markers, monuments. —Wallace 
Monument Co., Phone 396-2741.

18-tfc
Something new for vinyl and 

other hard surface floors. Seal 
Gloss ends frequent waxing. — 
McMahen Furniture Co. 22-ltc

TRAVELERS Loans made on 
peal estate for refinancing, ir­
rigation wells, etc. — Minnie 
Laura Jackson. 10-tfc

COMPACT Vacuum sales and 
«ervice, also used vacuums. Call W. D. Brannan, Phone 396-3741.

43-tfc

Business Opportunity
FOR SALE: All of the stock of 

merchandise and all of the fix­
tures of The Joy Shop. Phone 
396-5581. 22-tfc

FOR SALE or Trade: 26 seat 
Cafe, does good business, ideal 
for man and wife, living quar­
ters included, located at a truck 
stop, terms to any one having 
good credit. See or call V. T. 
Corbitt at 249-4486 or 249-4143 
in Dalhart, Texas. 21-4tc

Notice For Bids
Bids will be accepted until 

10:00 a. m. Monday, June 11, 
1962, for puttying the windows, 
repairing the screens, and paint­
ing the outside woodwork of the 
court house. We reserve the 
right to reject any and all bids. 
— Sherman County Commis­
sioners’ Court, by F. M. Keener, 
County Judge. 21-3tc

FOR ALL lynds of commer­
cial or home refrigeration ser- 
vtee, call Russell Beall, phone 
596-5121._________________5-tfc

FOR THE BEST in house mov­
ing, call 249-2084. — E. O.
Matthews, Dalhart. 50-tfc

FREE Removal of dead stock. 
t!all 396-3736 Stratford, or Dl 
0-2211 Amarillo Collect. — Am- 
fttillo Rendering Co. ‘ 49-tfc

Houses For Sale
FOR SALE or Rent: Four room 

Isoiise with bath, and two three- 
loom  apartments, on three lots. 
—  G . B. Parrish, Phone 396-5066.

22-4tp
FOR SALE: Our newly carpet- 

•©d liome on 8th  and Wall. Pric- 
«d reasonably. — Archie Wright, 
«all 396-2721 after 5:00 p. m.

19-tfc
FOR SALE: My home on cor­

n e r  of North Chestnut and 8th, 
2 bedrooms, double garage, 
across street from school. — 
Jack Vincent, Phone 396-3271.

17-tfc
FOR SALE: Three bedroom 

house; den, electric kitchen, 
carpeting, 1 3/4 baths; 1700 sq. 
I t .  Contact Lance Harrington, 
Phone 396-3226. 16-tfc

For Sale
FOR SALE: Two ton Whirl­

pool refrigerator air condition­
er, used one season, $150. — Mrs. 
Bessie Mitchell, Phone 396-3936.

22-2tc
FOR SALE: Used automatic 

washing machine, cheap. — Mrs. 
Nelda Tackett, Phone 396-2201.

22-ltc
FOR SALE: One new 1960 

model Frigidaire gas clothes 
dryer, reduced in price. •— 
Woolsey Appliances. 19-4tc

ORTHO Chemicals, Pax, Turf 
Magic, garden supplies, custom 
cattle spraying. — Farmer’s 
Supply. 14-tfc

SEVERAL Good used Living 
Room Suites. — McMahen Fur­
niture Co. 43-tfc

FOR SALE: Cushman High­
lander Scooter, $60.00. — J. L. 
Adams, Phone 396-9611. 20-3tc

FOR SALE: Cushman Super 
Eagle Scooter, like new. — 
Johnny Brannan, c/o W. D. 
Brannan. 16-tfc

FOR SALE: 1955 Ford pickup, 
V-8 3-speed. — Ronnie Pickens, 
Phone 396-3986. 18-tfc

FOR SALE: Modern House on 
three lots on South Chestnut. — 
Mrs. W. P. Brooks, Phone 396- 
4931. 15-tfc

FOR SALE: Three bedroom 
house, storm cellar and garage. 
Paved and curbed on 2 sides, 
fenced; large storage building. 
Bath newly tiled. Garbage dis­
posal. One block from school. 
Loan approved. — Ed Smith, 
Phone 396-4981. 12-tfc

FOR SALE: House on 2 V2 lots, 
paved, across street from park. 
^  Edward Brannan, 29-tfc

OUR HOME located at 8th  and 
Poplar for sale. Priced con­
siderably under appraised loan 
value. — E. A, McBryde, Phone 
396-3651. 34-tfe

FOR SALE: Three bedroom 
liouse, located on seven lots, 
oaving paid for. — Roy Mitchell.

24-tfc
FOR SALE: Two Story 7-room 

liouse on four lots. House is in­
sulated and has new roof. — 
D. C. Plunk. 15-tfc

FOR SALE: Income Property, 
one bedroom furnished house 
and two bedroom unfurnished 
house. Both modern. See F. 
L. Yates. 11-tfc

V. T. CORBITT Motors new 
& used House Trailers, cars and 
pickups. We buy, sell, trade and 
finance. You save $ when trad­
ing with us. Located on U. S. 
Highways 87 and 385 South in 
Dalhart, Texas. 16-tfc

Stone-Field custom tailored 
Suits, sport coats and slacks. 
Measured to fit. See Edward 
Brannan, Phone 396-3521. 46-tfc

FHA Meeting 
Held Wednesday

The FHA meeting Wednesday 
was called to order by the pres­
ident, who then read a  thank 
you note from Mrs. Cone Don- 
elson expressing her apprecia­
tion for the invitation to the 
tea, and what an enjoyable af­
fair it was.

An election of officers was 
held. 'Those elected were 
Louise Stone, president; Lanita 
Judd, vice-president; Marie 
Moore, secretary, Kathy Sneed, 
treasurer, Linda Reesing, par­

liamentarian and Donna Judd, 
reporter.

The program was presented 
by Mary Joyce Worley, who gave

a demonstration on the making 
of mints.

This meeting was the last 
meeting of the school year.

Stratford Abstract Co.
Minnie Laura Jackson, President

Incorporated 1907 — 55 years of Satisfactory Service 
to Sherman County Land Owners

Let Us Make Your Abstracts
WE SHOW THE RECORDS

OFFICE IN AMERICAN LEGION BUILDING

Pendleton Taken 
To Dumas Hospital

Royal Pendleton, 77, owner of 
the Sherman County Abstract 
Co. for 50 years was transferred 
Saturday from the Midland Hos­
pital to Dumas Memorial Hos­
pital.

He has been in the Midland 
hospital since March 30. He was 
in a car wreck near Albany at 
that time and suffered hip in­
juries. His wife was killed in 
the wreck.

RE5GARDLESS of so called cut 
prices and bargain numbers you 
can get better values in Carpet 
and Furniture at McMahen Fur­
niture Co. 20-tfc

For the best buys in Furni­
ture and carpet, see Woody 
Furniture Co., Dumas, Texas, 
call WE 5-4811 collect for free 
estimate. 38-tfc

Announcements

STRATFORD LODGE 874 
Grady R. Mullican, WM.
W. S. Frizzell Jr., Sec’y. 

STATED COMMUNICATION
Third Thursday Every Month

8:00 P. M.
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MAIL
Subscription Rates 
Doily and Sundoy
DAILY AND SUNDAY

One Y e a r ...........$21.00
Six Months . . . .  10.50 
Three Months . .  5.25
One Month . . . .  1.75

DAILY ONLY
One Y e a r ...........$15.60
Six Months . . . .  7.80
Three Months . .  3.90
One Month . . . .  i.30

Add l̂ /o State Sales Tax 
to Above Prices

All Mall Subscriptions 
Payable in Advance

Dortch Chosen 
For Boys State

Dick Dortch, student leader 
and two-year football letter- 
man at Irving High School, has 
been selected by the American 
Legion’s Irving post as its repre­
sentative to the annual “Boys 
State” in Austin.

He is the grandson of Mr. and 
Mrs. Corum Dortch.

His parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard B. Dortch, formerly of 
Stratford.

At the June 3-9 event, the 
16-year old IHS junior will re­
ceive education in the duties, 
po^vileges, and responsibilities 
of American citizenship, with 
particular emphasis on the 
mechanics of democratic gov­
ernment.

Participants in Boys’ State 
find themselves participating 
in a model government with 
exactly the same functions as 
the real office-holders in ev­
eryday life.

Dick Dortch is a member of 
the First Methodist Church and 
is a bass in the IHS a cappella 
choir. He is a  nominee for 
president of the Teen Chamber 
of Commerce and also is run­
ning for president of the IHS 
student body.

Hygiene authorities advise us 
not to moisten our fingers 
when counting our money. 
We’re not worried. No germ 
could live on our salary.

NK
Hybrid

Sorghums
are

GREEN-
TREATED
GREEN-TREATED is a 
new insecticide-fungicide 
seed treatment developed by 
NK sorghum researchers. 
The seed you buy is green 
and represents the best avail­
able protection against in­
sects and disease. GREEN- 
TREATED seed is yoms at 
no extra cost. Remember, 
only NK hybrid sorghum 
seed is GREEN-TREAT­
ED. See us for more details.

Vernon Morris
Phone 948-1432 

SUNRAY

Notice of the Names of Persons Appearing as the 
Owners of Unclaimed Amounts Held By:

The First State 
Bank Of 
Stratford

STRATFORD, TEXAS
This notice is given and published pursuant to Section 3, Article 3272b, R. C- S. 1925, as 
enacted by the Third Called Session, 57th Legislature of the State of Texas, effective 
May 3, 1962. This information is given in an effort to locate persons who are the de­
positors or owners of amounts in accounts that have remained inactive or dormant ac­
cording to the provisions of Article 3272b for more than seven (7) years. The deposi­
tory named above does not know the whereabouts of the depositors or owners listed 
below.
The amounts due the depositors or owners listed herein will be paid upon proof of 
ownership at the office of the depository named above. Any amount not claimed 
within nine (9) months of the date of this publication may be subject to report to and 
conservation by the State Treasurer in accordance with Article 3272b, Title 53, Re­
vised Civil Statutes of Texas. 'The amount charged by the newspaper for this adver­
tisement does not exceed the rate for legal notice publications fixed in Article 29, R. C. 
S. of Texas 1925, as amended, and the amount so paid may be charged equally against 
the accounts owing to the persons whose names are published.

LAST KNOWN ADDRESS
Names of Missing Depositors Route; Box No.; No. & St. City and State

Thompson, R. E. Unknown Unknown
Threlkild, C. V. Unknown Unknown
Threlkeld, W. A. Unknown Unknown
Tinsley, Mrs. Ethel Unknown Unknown
Tippit, B. R. Unknown Unknown
Treas. Ind. School Dist. Unknown Unknown
Triplett, Aquilla Unknown Unknown
Tuggle, C. M. Unknown Unknown
Turner, F. W. Unknown Unknown
Turner, Mrs. Henry Unknown Unknown
Turner, U. T. Unknown Unknown
Tweedy, Clem Unknown Unknown
Twonbly, Mrs. L. A. Unknown Unknown
Ulery, J. F. Box 695 Texhoma, Oklahoma
UUom, P. L. Unknown Unknown
Victory Council Fund Unknown Unknown
Viertal, M. A. Unknown Unknown
Waddell, A. S. Unknown Unknown
Wadley, Woodson, Sec. Unknown Kerrick, Texas
Wakefield, Ullom Unknown Stratford, Texas
Walker Brothers Unknown Unknown
Walker, A. D. Unknown Unknown
Walker, Vemie Unknown Unknown
Wall, 0 . M. Unknown Unknown
Wallace, Guy Unknown Unknown
Wallis, Benny Box 91 Stratford, Texas
Ward, Cecil L. Unknown Stratford, Texas
Ward, Geo., Estate of Unknown Unknown
Waters, J. A. Unknown Unknown
Watson, Mrs. Annie Unknown Unknovm
Wears, Nora L. Unknown Unkr.f wn
Webb, Arthur Unknown Stratford, Texas
Webster, Elizabeth and Thomas Unknown Unknown
Weems, Roy Unknown Unknown
Weems, R. S. Unknown Unknown
Wells, Mrs. Annette Unknown Unknown
Wells, J. S. Unknown Unknown
West, Mrs. Leatrice Unknown Unknown
White, Ranel Unknown Unknown
White, W. A. Unknown Unknown
Whitson, John R. Unknown Unknown
Williams, Samuel M. or Faye Unknown Unknown
Williams, Mr. or Mrs. Ted O. Unknown Unknown
Willis, Florence Unknown Unknown
wmis, H .C. Unknown Unknown
Wilson, A. L., Jr. Unknown Si>earman, Texas
Wilson, Vert Unknown Choctaw, Oklahoma
Womack, G. E. Unknown Unknown
Wood, Bruce, Woodman Circle 
Wood, Lora & Powers, Alta, 

Admix, of the Estate of

Unknown Unknown

Bruce Wood Unknown Unknown
Woodman, A. R. Unknown Unknown
Woodruff, John Unknown Unknown
Wright, J. S. Unknown Unknown
Young, M. A. Unknown Dalhart, Texas
Y. M. C. A. Fund Unknown Unknown

Affidavit Of Depository Officer
THE STATE OF TEXAS, COUNTY OF SHERMAN
Before me, the undersigned authority, on this day personahy appeared O. H. OQUIN, 
who, after being by me duly sworn, deposes, says, and certifies as true the following:
1. That he is Vice-President & Cashier of The First State Bank of Stratford, Stratford 
Texas, the Depository named in the above Notice.
2. That the foregoing is a full and complete list of the names of all depositors and 
creditors for whom dormant deposits or inactive accounts have been held for more 
than seven (7) years and whose existence and whereabouts are unknown to the Depos­
itory.
3. That such listed depositors and creditors have not asserted any claim or exercised 
any act of ownership with respect to their deposits or accounts during the past seven 
(7) years. O. H. OQUIN
Sfwom to and subscribed before me this the 24 day of May, 1962.
(Seal) NYNVIA MILLS Notary Public, Sherman County, Texas.
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Lions Club To 
Donate $150 To 
Boy Scout Hut

Stratford Lions Club will do­
nate $150 to the Stratford Boy 
Scout building fund. Most of 
the money was raised a t the an­
nual pancake supper served by 
tìhe lions, Jesse Scarborough, 
club secretary reports.

Get Wise and Advextise! •

J. F. Frisz 
To Graduate 
In Austin

Joseph Frederic Frisz, grand­
son of the late C. R. Bonar, will 
graduate May 31 from St. Ste­
phens School in Austin.

Frisz was bom in Lima, Peru. 
At present his parents are mak­
ing their home in Caracas, 
Venzuela. His mother, Mrs. 
Frisz, is the former Lucille Bo­
nar of Stratford.

VOTE SATU R.D ay -  J U N E 2
Promote

HOUSE SPEAKER
James A . "Jimmy'

Lieutenant Governor
The O nly Candidate with Experience  

In O rganizing A  Legislative Body

The Turrmn  Action Program:
A Balanced State Budget 
Continued Educational Improvements
Small loan regulations to eliminate 

loan sharks
Stronger Code of Ethics for 

State Officials
Improved Benefits for the Aged 
Adequate Juvenile Parole System 
Equal Legal Rights for Women 
A Fair Auto Insurance Program 
Curbs on Obscene Movies and Literature

$1,078.59 Has 
Been Contributed 
To Cancer Fund

The Sherman County Unit re­
ports that $1,078.59 has been 
contributed to the 1962 Cancer 
Crusade to date. $35.(K) of the 
amount has been for Memorials.

Among the Sick
H. T. Jackson, a resident of 

Coon Memorial Home in Dal- 
hart, was admitted to Coon Me­
morial Hospital with pneu­
monia Monday. He is respond­
ing to treatment and doing nice­
ly.

(Pd. Pol. Adv.;

Marlin Knight, 6-year old son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Dale Knight, 
was brought home Tuesday from 
Methodist Hospital in Lubbock 
where he was hospitalized Fri­
day night. Mrs. Knight and 
children were visiting in the 
home of her parents in Shal- 
lowater. Marlin became vio­
lently ill during the night. He 
had developed a toxoid from a 
smallpox vaccine he had taken 
recently. He was rushed to the 
hospital with a fever of 105 de­
grees. Dale Knight was on a 
fishing trip at Lake City, Colo­
rado at the time his »>n ¡became
m.

Mrs. Gene Wilson was brought 
home Saturday from Moore 
County Memorial Hospital in 
Dumas where she recently un­
derwent surgery.

Mrs. Demus Eller is a medical 
patient in the Dumas hospital.

Mrs. V. A. Plunk underwent 
major surgery in the Dumas 
hospital Tuesday morning.

F. B. Mullins, who underwent 
surgery in Dumas Thursday of 
last week, was brought home 
Tuesday, and reports that he is 
doing nicely.

No Susie, the girl who knows 
all the answers hasn’t been out 
with questionable men.

tain the high quality that eggs 
have when laid, he says.

It Pays to read Star ads.

Night clubs nowadays remind 
us of the gay nineties. The 
women are gay, and the men are 
around ninety.

Breakfasts
AFTER 6:00 A. M.

TASTY HOME SEASONED

Meals and Short Orders 
Fern’s 287 Truck Stop Cafe

WE CLOSE ON SUNDAYS

POOR GUY
A report from a hotel manager 

shows that a guest recently 
woke up everyone in the house 
one night screaming, “I t’s in the 
phone book! I t ’s in the phone 
book1”

The manager got the house 
detective and they let them­
selves into the man’s room. He 
was in the midst of a  nightmare. 
They aroused him and asiked 
what the matter was.

“I was having a horrible 
dream”, said the guest apologiz­
ing. “I dreamed the income 
tax people wanted to send me a 
big refund, but they’d lost my 
address”.

Profit, service, customer satis­
faction and good marketing 
management are four mighty 
i m p o r t a n t  o b j e c ­
t i v e s  for poultry- 
men, retailers and other hand­
lers of eggs, says F. Z. Bean- 
blossom, extension poultry mar­

keting specialist. How well
these objectives are carried out 
can have a strong bearing on 
how successful each will be in 
business, he adds. With the
coming of warmer weather, all 
must be on the alert for hand­
ling practices which will main-

FEET ACHE, ITCH?
of all your bones are in the 

feet. No wonder they ache, swell, 
perspire, itch. Bathe feet twice 
daily with T-4-L Solution for re­
lief of the 52 bones, 66 joints 
plus ligaments. Curbs athlete’s 
foot, too (sloughs off infection— 
watch healthy skin replace it) or 
your 48  ̂ back at any drug store 
if not pleased IN ONE HOUR. 
TODAY at all drug stores.

ALCOHOLICS ANONYMOUS
AA Group Meets in Dalhart 
Every Tuesday — 8:00 P. M.

Stratford Phone: 396-3533 
Dalhart Phones: 249-4214 or

249-2040

"  NOTICE --
We Will Give Cash Prizes 
For the Best Guesses on 

When the First 1962 Load 
Of Dry Wheat

(14% or less moisture)
Is delivered at our elevators either at 
Lautz or in Stratford, This will be open 
to all landowners and tenants in our 
trade territory.

All entries should be made by post­
card, and only one guess per family.

The date, hour and minute should be 
guessed, and in order to be eligible, en­
tries cannot be postmarked later than 
June 1, 1962.

Prizes will be $100, $50, $25, $15 
and $10 for the best five guesses.

Stratford Grain Co.

Land Sale — The R. E. Wamble Estate
May Turner DeWitt and R. H. Holland, Co-Executors, will offer for Sale on the 5th day of June, 1962, at 10:00 A. M., the fol­
lowing described real estate situated in Ochiltree County, Texas; approximately 22 miles Southwest of Perryton, Texas:

TRACT 1 TRACT 2 TRACT 3 TRACT 4
That poriton of the East 880 acres of the J. J. 
Ballentine Survey, situated North of State High­
way, containing approximately 290 acres.

That portion of the East 880 acres of the J. J. 
Ballentine Survey, situated South of State High­
way, containing approximately 590 acres.

That portion of the West 547 acres of the J. J. 
Ballentine Survey, lying South of State High­
way, containing approximately 336 acres.

Special Information -  TRACTS 1 AND 2
Tracts 1 and 2 are presently operated together as a single unit. This unit (comprised of Tracts 1 and 
2) has the following crop allotments:

Wheat 525 acres
Maize 277 acres
Cotton 65 acres

All of Tracts 1 and 2 is in cultivation. Tract 1 contains 290 acres, part of which is now being irrigated 
from a well located on Tract 2 via a culvert under paved highway separating the two tracts. Ail of 
this tract is irrigable. Tract 2 contains 590 acres, part of which is now being irrigated from two wells 
situated on Tract 2. One well is located a short distance North of the center of Tract 2 and the other 
well is situated in the approximate center at the south line of Tract 2. Tract 2 has one windmill. All 
of Tract 2 is irrigable.
In the event that Tract 1 and Tract 2 are sold to different purchasers, then the crop allotments will be 
prorated between these two tracts on an acreage basis.

That portion of the West 547 acres of the J. J.
Ballentine Survey lying North of State Highway 
containing approximately 211 acres and the 
North 196 acres of the J. T. Pollard Survey, said 
tract No. 3 containing approximately 407 acres.

Special Information -  TRACTS 3 AND 4
Tracts 3 and 4 are presently operated together as a single unit. This unit (comprised of Tracts 3 and 
4) has the following crop allotments:

Wheat 422 acres
Maize 176 acres
Cotton 22 acres

All of Tracts 3 and 4 is in cultivation except approximately 95 acres of grassland in the south portion 
of Tract 4. Tract 4 has an irrigation well situated in the northwest corner of said tract. Tract 3 con­
tains approximately 407 acres, a portion of which is now being irrigated from a well located on Tract 
4 via a culvert under paved highway sejwrating the two tracts. Tract 4 contains approximately 336 
acres, a portion of whieh is now being irrigated. Tract 3 has a windmill and tanks situated in the 
approximate center of the north line and Tract 4 has a trench silo situated on the grassland portion. 
All of the cultivated land on both tracts is irrigable.
In the event that Tract 3 and Tract 4 are sold to different purchasers, then the crop allotments will be 
prorated between these two tracts on an acreage basis.

All of the above tracts are on paved roads, Tracts 1 and 3 being separated from Tracts 2 and 4 by a State farm-to-market hard surfaced highway.

And tbe following described real estate situated in Sberman County, Texas:

TRACT 5 T E R M S
The East One-Half (E/2) of Section 206, Block 1-C, GH&H Ry. Co. Survey, situat­
ed in Sherman County, Texas, approximately 8 miles East of Stratford, Texas, 
containing 320 acres, more or less.

SPECIAL INFORMATION — TRACT 5
All of Tract 5 is in cultivation and is irrigable. It has the following crop allot­
ments:

Grain Sorghum 177 acres 
Wheat 122Î4 acres

This tract has one (1) eight-inch ii^gation well and there is a producing gas well 
on it.

Cash. Buyer gets Vz of minerals. All of this land is now subject tô  oil and 
gas lease. Bights of tenants in possession terminate upon completion of harv^t 
of 1962 crops. Possession of land on which crops are now growing will be deliv­
ered upon the completion of the harvest of 1962 crops and possession of fallow 
land will be delivered upon closing of sale.

Bids will be accepted on the following basis:
(a) On all tracts as a single unit.
(b) On Tracts 1 and 2 as a unit.
(c) On Tracts 3 and 4 as a unit.
(d) On Tracts 1 and 3 as a unit.
(e) On Tracts 2 and 4 as a unit.
(f) On each separate tract.
(g) Tract 5 will be sold as a separate unit.

Bids will be accepted up to 10:00 A. M. on the 5th day of^June; 196 ,̂ and bids will be opened at the office of Lemon, Close & Atkinson, 311 South Main, Pejrryton, Texas, at 10:00 A. M. on the 5th day of June, 1962, at 
which time all bidders are invited to be present and after bids are opened anyone present may increase his bid. Purchaser will be expected to put up 10% of purchase price and execute sales contract.
The executors reserve the right to reject any and all bids submitted.
Bids should be submitted to either of the following, who can also furnish additional information:

R. H. Holland 
Tbe First National Bank 
Perryton, Texas 
Telephone 435-3676

R. D. Lemon 
311 South Main 
Perryton, Texas 
Telephone 435-3623
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Annual FFA 
Father And Son 
Banquet Saturday

>i -
Stratford Future Farmers of 

America honored their fathers 
with a hanquet in the school 
cafeteria Saturday evening. 
Joyce Scott, chapter sweet­
heart, was an honor guest.

Cleo Aduddell gave the invo­
cation. Dean Roper was the 
program emcee.

Gifts were presented to Leslie 
Parker and P. J. Pronger Jr. 
Parker barbecued the beef 
which was donated by Pronger.

A trio composed of Gail 
Sever, Linda Plunk and Orlanda 
Lasley, accompaned at the 
piano by Sue Hudson, sang two 
songs.

Rev. M. E. Upchurch, pastor of 
the First Baptist Church, was 
the speeder of the evening. He 
said the purpose of the father 
and son banquet was for the 
boys to publicly show their ap­
preciation of the assistance 
which had been given them by 
their fathers. He told of the 
difference between price value 
and a fair return value for 
which merchandise is bartered.

“Values vary in livestock. 
Some one may help you and 
give you fair pay in return for 
your efforts. While takng part

Joyce Scott, FFA Sweetheart

in the feeding program, on some 
cold morning, you may ' have 
looked at your calf and said, 
you had better pay off and give 
something back in return,” he 
told the boys. “Maybe the calf 
did”.

“There are times when your 
fathers may stand by and say of 
you, you had better come 
through and had better pro­
duce. l ip  service is not enough. 
You must produce by your deed 
while abiding by the rules of 
the home”. .

Rev. Upchurch told the Bible 
story of the prodical son, and 
said that only when the prodi­
cal son returned to his father’s

the MORE They Graze 
the MORE It Grows

Stratford Butane Co.

house, asking for a place as a 
servant, did the son show a real 
appreciation of the many things 
his fathet had done for him.

The speaker encouraged; , t^ie 
boys to carry:! out the theme of 
the banquet in:-their daily dives, 
for he said, “ybu Will firid that 
yoûr!^^àd"%,'pri^ jdd tlie greatest 
guy^':j^u,,^l; -ever 

Duard Lamb presented ; the 
awards. Lewis James received 
thé livestock award. 'Oleo Adud­
dell was presented the safety 
award. The varied crops award 
went to Robert Meek. Lynn Al­
len received the farm mechanics 
av/ard. The farm electrifica­
tion award went to James Brit­
ten.

Lewis James won the Star 
Green Hand Farmer award 
which is presented to a fresh­
man taking part in the largest 
variety of programs.

Ronnie Pickens was present­
ed with the Star Farmer award 
which is presented to a senior 
boy.

The DeKalb award for aeçom- 
pb'shments went to Jimmy Hud-
sorl'

Sons and fathers attending 
the banquet were: Cleo Adud­
dell and Paul Aduddell, Keith 
Borth and Kenneth Borth, Ron­
nie Pickens, Rickey Pickens and 
Kenneth Pickens, Dean Roper, 
Herman Borth and D. A. Borth, 
James Britten and W. M. Brit­
ten, Charley Crabtree and New­
ton Crabtree, Tommy Green, 
Doug McBryde and D. P. Mc- 
Bryde, Lynn Allen and George 
Allen, Phil Dettle, Gary Hud­
son, Jimmy Hudson and N. W. 
Hudson, Jesse Little and H. L. 
Little, Dennis Plunk and 
Leonard Plunk, Charles Riggs 
and Everett Riggs, Sandy Til­
lery and Rex Tillery, Don Wil­
liams and Claude Williams, Joe 
Boren and Allen Boren, John 
Brannan and W. D. Brannan, 
Jerry Burkham and Marvin 
Burkham, Johnny Crownover 
and L. M. Crownover, Milford 
Davis and Jesse Davis, Lanny 
Harris, and Roy Harris, Lewis 
James and Newton James, Rob­
ert Meek and Leo Meek, Eddie 
Moon and Donald Moon, Bobby 
Pendleton and Bill Pendleton, 
Don Roper, Boyd Spurlock and 
Alvin Spurlock, Mark Lamb and 
Charley Lamb.

Other guests at the banquet 
included: P. J. Pronger II, P. J. 
Pronger III, Earl Riffe, Frank 
Judd, R. W. Standefer Jr., Roy 
Combs, R. J. Hill, Bill Martin, 
Walter Lasley, Bill Pendleton, 
Rev. M. E. Upchurch, John Up­
church, Sonny Judd, Arthur 
Judd, Brown Ross, J. E. Sum- 
merour. Bill Gillenwaters, Bas­
kin Brown, Leslie Parker, Mike 
Wells and Ed Crabtree.

Mothers assisting with the 
banquet were: Mrs. N. W. Hud-

Mrs. Ferguson 
Is Hostess To

Priscilla Club
' The Priscilla Club met May 22 
in the himie of Mrs. Wanda Fer­
guson. for a .pleasant, afternoon 
of visitine and sewing. ^

Delicious refreshments of

son, Mrs. Kenneth Borth, Mrs. 
Paul Aduddell, Mrs. Kenneth 
Pickens, Mrs. Charley Lamb and 
Mrs. George Allen.

sandwiches, potato chips, relish- 
e s , c o o k i e s ,  cof- 
f e e a n d  soft drinks 
were enjoyed by members, Mrs. 
Velma Wyatt, Mrs. Ada Mae 
Browder and Nancy, Mrs. Alma 
Rosé and Sandra, -Mrs. Mary 
Cowley and Madell, Mrs, Sybil 
Boney, Mrs. Ruth Morns, Sheriy 
and Renee, Mrs. Mary Belle 
Morris, Mrs. Francis ÈrOwder, 
Mrs. Bettie Craig, Carrie and 
Jim Ferguson, and^ the hostess, 
Mrs. Ferguson.

The next meeting will be with 
Mrs. Ruth Morris on Tuesday, 
June 5.

For a colorful salad, put to­
gether sections from 2 grapefruits, 
2 cups grated carrots and wedges 
from one avocado. Spoon into let­
tuce cups and pour over some 
Italian dressing.

Day-old white cake can be 
crumbled, folded into whipped 
cream flavored with brown sugar 
and lemon extract, then spooned 
into cling peach halves for a 
family dessert.

A nice pancake variation: add 
to the batter thinly roasted diced

Helen’s Favorite:
Hash and Egg Skillet 

(Serves 6)
2 No. 2 cans corned beef hash 
Vi cup grated onion 
Salt and pepper 
1 tablespoon-butter 
6 eggs

Combine hash, onion, salt 
and pepper. Melt butter in bot­
tom of 10-inch skillet and pack 
in the hash mixture. Make six 
depressions svith bottom of 
custard ; cup nn^tdfop an egg 
in each, Covjpr,. .Cook slowly 
about 15 minutés or until eggs 
are set. Serve ât once.

almonds and thinly-sliced ba­
nana.

Wrap “bundles” of whole green 
beans, cooked, in pimiento. strips, 
sprinkle with capers and serve 
with French or Italian dressing.

Arrange fresh grapefruit sec­
tions over baked rice pudding. 
Sprinkle with butter and brown 
sugar, then place under broiler 
to melt the sugar, about 5 min­
utes. Serve hot.

Make a fruit salad dressing by 
blending together 2 parts mayon­
naise with 1 part honey and add 
chopped dates to it.
■ Blend"% "cup “of se^same ; feeds 
with V2 cup bread crumbs m use 
for breading chicken for frying. 
Dip chicken into egg mixed with 
water first to make coating ad- 
heie better.

School Is Out -  Lets Go Picniemg

WE WILL BE CLOSED 
A U  DAY WEDNESDAY 

MEMORIAL DAY

Beef Roast
U.S.D.A. Good -  Chuck
POUND

P I C N I C
Sunray
4 TO 7 POUND — WHOLE — POUND

HAMBURGER MEAT
All Meat
FRESH GROUND — POUND

HAMBURGER BUNS
MEAD’S
2 Packages Large For

Wieners
PINKNEY

3  poi|nd package

Hot Dog Buns
Mead’s
PACKAGE

Charcoal -  Briquets
CHUCK WAGON
5 Pound Bag

BARBECUE SAUCE
KRAFT SMOKED OR PLAIN
18 Ounce Bottle

PURE MUSTARD
KIMBELL’S
9 Ounce Jar
2 jars for

POTATO CHIPS
Mead’s
2 ” 29cpkgs. for

Sour or Dill PICKLES
Alabam Girl
BIG 48 OîtNCÉ .TAR

PAPER PLATES
Bondware 
Pkg. of 150 count

N A P K I N S
Kim
ASSORTED COLORS — PACKAGE

THE HANDY FAMILY
WHERE ARE WE )  IT SEEM S ^  
601N& TO PUT ALL \  WE'RE ALWAV5  ̂
THIS EXTRA PAINT/ ) RUNNINS- OUT OP 

PAP? y  STORAGE SPVhCE
■^OWN HERE IN THE 
BASEMENT-BUT 1  

HAVE A SOLUTIONTO 
THAT PROBLEM. ,

BY LLOYD BIRMINGHAM

Éaí ' / Ü B
COf*. 19Í2 iY O B «lA l KATWB  
COtf.TM-WOilDtnGMISBESWYHÏ

PAD'S ’’A D O -A -S H E LF "
BASEIVVENT BEAMS

HANS SHELVES,CUT TO 
DESIRED SIZE, ON HEAVy 
W IRE FRAMES. SHELVES 

/MAY BE ADDED AS NEEDED

Tuesday -  Double Stamps with 
$2.50 Cash Purchase or more 

Plus T uesday Specials
Redemption Center In Our Store

Elberta PEACHES
SUNDRENCHED
No. 2  ̂ Tin — 26^
4  cans for

P E A R S
SUNDRENCHED
No. 24 Tin

ORANGE JUICE
TEXSUN
46 Ounce Tin

SA U D  DRESSING
KIMBELL’S
Quart Jar

Peanut Butter
KIMBELL’S

12 ounce jar

STUFFED OLIVES
HAASE’S
No. ? 2  Bottle
2 bottles for

M I L K
KIMBELL’S
3 Tall Cans for

SHORTENING
SNOWDRIFT — 10^ OFF LABEL
3 Pound Tin

39
PORK & BEANS
JACK SPRAT
No. 300 Tin — 10^
I I  cans for

p .R _ 0 -D -U -O i 
F R E S H  C O R N
4  ears for

S Q U A S H
No. 1 Texas Yellow
POUND 10
GREHÜ BEANS
Fancy Fresh ■ 
'Valchtine -  pound

G R A P E F R U I T
FLORIDA MARSH SEEDLESS
Large Size; 3 For

ALBERT’S GROCERY
&  M A R K E T - - Phone 39G-4821


