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Robert Lee slates Labor Day festivities
There will be something for 

everyone on S a tu rd a y , 
September 3 at the 5th annu­
al Labor Day Extravaganza in 
Robert Lee. The slate of ac­
tivities is held each year in the 
shady county park adjacent to 
the swimming pool and is 
sponsored by West Coke 
County Community Develop­
ment.

The Rabbit Twister BBQ 
and C. A. S. I. Chili Cookoff will 
be in full swing early on 
Saturday. The e n tra n ts  
always welcome visitors to

look over their campsite and 
chat. Volunteer judges will be 
needed all day for taste 
testing, said Laura Crenshaw, 
chairman.

Arts and craft articles, as well 
as other items for sale, will be 
set up under the trees by 9 
am. A number of food and 
drink booths will also be open 
for refreshments. Food 
booths include Pearson's 
BBQ, Lions Club hamburgers, 
and Coke County Bass Club 
fish and fries. It's not too late 
to add vour booth to the fun.

McCorkle plays in all-star game

Jennifer McCorkle
Jennifer McCorkle of BHS 

was named to the Division II 
West All Star Team. She and 
her team-mates competed in 
Arlington during the Texas 
Girl's Coaches Association all 
Star Tournament. <

Arriving in Arlington on July 
5th, Jennifer met up with the 
rest of her team and got ac­
quainted with them. A fter 
lunch the team went to the 
gym to practice. "It was so- 
amazing at how we just clicked 
at the first. It was like we all 
had played together in high 
school," McCorkle said. That 
evening the group's chaper­
one took the girls for some 
shopping at a nearby mall.

Tuesday morning, the 6th, 
the girls woke up to full day of 
practice and many surprises 
ahead of them. After a full day 
of volleyball it was time to 
broaden their athletic minds. 
They attended a Texas 
Rangers baseball game. 
McCorkle said, "One of the 
most memorable things of the 
baseball game was getting to 
meet the players from the 
Holland Soccer team. They 
were sitting a row in front of us 
and they were trying to get 
the wave started so we 
helped them get everyone

around us to do it."
On Wednesday morning, 

the girls and some of the oth­
er teams demonstrated for the 
coaches at the coaching 
clinic. McCorkle says it was 
fun but they were a little ner­
vous because there were 
college scouts there watch­
ing. Later that afternoon, the 
volleyball, basketball, and 
track all stars were honored at 
a luncheon held at the Cham­
pions Ballroom at the Marriot 
Hotel. When that was over, 
the girls started to get ready 
for the big game that night.

"When we first got to the 
coliseum, we were all like, 'this 
is it'." Our last game of our 
high school career. Let's go 
out and play like there is no 
tomorrow. Like it is our last 
game ever," re m a rk e d  
Jennifer. During the pre­
game, each team w a s  
introduced and the players 
and coaches were awarded 
watches. Then it was time for 
the games to begin. The 
West team fell 15-12 to the 
East team the first game. In 
the second game the West 
was determined to win but the 
determination of the East was 
greater causing them to de­
feat the West 15-12 once 
again. In the third game the 
West came out strong and 
dominated the serving, but 
serving alone was not enough 
to win, and the West fell short 
15-13.

"Playing in this game was an 
experience I'll never forget. I 
wish everyone could have a 
chance to play in something 
like this. It is an honor and I 
have made some memories 
that will last a lifetime," 
Jennifer stated.

Call Debbie Wilkes 453-2819.
"Shockwave", deejay Tim 

Wagner, will be present all day 
for music and announce­
ments. He will also be pro­
viding music for the free  
dance on the tennis courts at 
8 pm.

The Beach volleyball tour­
nament, always a fun event, 
will be held all day Saturday. 
For entries, information, and 
volunteers, please call Jose 
and Sandie Saucedo, 453- 
2739 or Rosa Long, 453- 
2148 after five.

Red Canyon Archery Club 
will again host an archery 
match in the Mt. Creek Am­
phitheatre. Contact Jeff Eu­
banks for more information at 
453-2475.

Horseshoe and w asher 
pitching will be available with 
Doug or Debbie Wilkes, 453- 
2819 taking the calls.

At 10 am, Bronte's Happy 
Harts Square Dance Club will 
put on a dance exhibition on 
the tennis courts. Many peo­
ple haven't seen squa re  
dancing up close a n d  
personal for many years. 
Watch this fun event.

Kids, enter the washable 
free chalk art contest! Nancy 
Wyatt will be in charge of the 
contest for kids up to 10 years 
of age. Think big! Chalk will 
be provided. The contest will 
start on the tennis courts im­
mediately after the square 
dancers perform.

The 4-H Club will have two 
booths - their Ring Toss for 
drinks and a new Duck game.

A longtime favorite - a 
Dunkin' Booth - will be spon­
sored by WCCCD with local 
celebrities as the "dunkees".

Other fun things may be 
added before Sept. 3 - the 
children's train, additional 
booths, food, domino tour­
nament, and others. Bring 
your lawn chairs or blanket 
and plan to spend the day 
with your neighbors.

Tuesday Dance
The Coke County Cavaliers 

will provide C/W music for the 
Tuesday Special Dance on 
August 23 at 7:30 pm. Held 
the fourth Tuesday of each 
month at the Rec Hall in 
Robert Lee, it is for dancers of 
all ages and tickets are avail­
able at the door.
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...Upcoming
4-H booths at 
Extravaganza

4-H will be sponsoring two 
booths this year at the Labor 
Day Extravaganza September 
3, 1994. 4-H will have their 
traditional Ring Toss Booth. 
Participants just have to ring a 
soft drink and it's yours to 
keep. The new booth will 
consist of a duck pond. Just 
come fish out a duck and re­
ceive your prize. Young and 
old kids at heart will enjoy this 
booth. So come support the 
4-H clubs and visit our booth.

Blackwell school 
pictures

School pictures for stu­
dents and pre-schoolers in 
Blackwell will be made at the 
old gym, in Blackwell at 8 am, 
Tuesday, August 23.

WCC EMS
The West Coke County 

EMS will meet Tuesday, Au­
gust 23, 1994, at the City Hall 
in Robert Lee. Members are 
reminded that the meeting will 
be held at 5:15 pm.

RLISD Calendar 
happenings

On Tuesday, August 23, 
Robert Lee school pictures 
will be taken for Kindergarten 
through 11th grade. An 
Open House will be held as 
well on Tuesday evening from 
7:00 - 8:00 pm at the high 
school.

Thursday, August 25, the 
Steers will scrimmage the 
Christoval Cougars at 5:00 pm 
in Robert Lee.

Bronte All
Sports Boosters
The Bronte All Sports 

Boosters will hold a meeting 
Monday, August 22, 1994 at 
7:00 pm in the Bronte School 
Cafeteria to elect officers for 
the 1994-95 school year. All 
parents with Jr. High or high 
school athletes, regardless of 
what sport they participate ihj 
and any other Longhorn fart, 
are asked to please come and 
help support our young peO‘‘ 
pie.
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Obituaries

Hudson
Mozelle Taylor Hudson, 82, 

of San Angelo died Thursday, 
August 11, 1994, at her resi­
dence.

Service was held at 2:00 pm 
Saturday, August 13, at the 
St. Luke Methodist Church 
with the Rev. Clint Rabb 
officiating. Interment followed 
Saturday in Robert Lee 
Cemetery under the direction 
of Johnson's Funeral Home.

Mozelle was born April 29, 
1912, in Tennyson. Her par­
ents were Darwin and Kate 
Ainsworth Sayner. She grew 
up on the Sayner ranch at 
Tennyson. Mozelle graduat­
ed from high school In San 
Angelo and was proud to be 
an alumnus of Angelo State 
University. She continued 
her education over the years 
and made many lifelong 
friends during her school days 
in San Angelo.

Mozelle married George 
Lee Taylor on May 29, 1935. 
He was a teacher and coach in 
Robert Lee. Their two chil­
dren were born in Robert Lee 
where they lived until 1946 
when they moved to San An­
gelo. Mr. Taylor died in 1977. 
Mozelle married Commie C. 
Hudson August 15, 1981. 
They lived in Abilene for the 
first years of their marriage and 
returned to San Angelo in 
1986. Mr. Hudson died in 
1989.

Mozelle's interests were her 
family, her friends, and paint­
ing. She made many friends 
through her art and was an 
accomplished amateur painter 
who won numerous awards in 
local and regional art shows. 
One of her award-winning 
paintings is on permanent 
display in Austin.

Survivors include one 
daughter, Judith T. Bond of 
Golden, Colorado: one son,

SS Rep. to visit
Garland Gregg, representa­

tive for the San Angelo Social 
Security Office, has sched­
uled his August visit to Robert 
Lee and Bronte. He will be in 
the Conference Room of the 
County Courthouse in Robert 
Lee on Thursday, August 25, 
between 11:00 am and 11:30 
am and in the Council Room 
of Bronte City Hall the same 
afternoon, 1:30 - 2:00 pm.

Anyone who wants to file a 
claim for benefits, g e t  
information, or transact other 
business with the Social Se­
curity Administration may 
contact him at this time.

George L. Taylor, Jr. of Hous­
ton; three grandchildren; 
three brothers and sisters-in- 
law, S.C. and Maggie Sayner 
of Tennyson, Worth and 
Omega Sayner of Snyder and 
Frank and Lillie Mae Sayner of 
Granbury; and a longtime care 
giver, Ardelia Evans.

Hurley
Royce Gene Hurley, a re­

tired Federal Aviation Admin­
istration personnel officer, 
died Tuesday, August 8, at a 
Bedford hospital. He was 67.

The funeral was held at 9:30 
am Friday, August 12, at Lu­
cas Funeral Home in Hurst. 
Burial was in Robert Lee at the 
Edith Cemetery Saturday, 
August 13.

Royce was born in Carrizzo 
Springs and had lived in Hal- 
torn City for 33 years. He was 
a graduate of San Angelo 
High School and the 
University of New Mexico with 
a degree in fine arts.

Royce worked for the FAA 
for more than 30 years before 
his retirement.

He was a member of Willow- 
Springs Golf Club.

The family suggest that 
memorials be made to the 
American Cancer Society, P. 
O. Box 211511, Bedford, 
Texas 76095.

Royce is survived by his 
wife, Doris Hurley of Haltom 
City: a son, Monte Hurley, of 
Keller; a daughter and son-in- 
law, Carla and Byron Green of 
Burleson; his mother, Mae 
Hurley of Robert Lee; a 
brother, Elmer Hurley of 
Bronte; and two grandchil­
dren, Trey and Annie Green 
of Burleson.

Letter to 
the Editor

Dear Editor,
This is my statement and 

resignation from the board of 
directors of East Coke County 
Hospital District, (Bronte 
Nursing Home, on August 9, 
1994.

To the Board of Directors of 
East Coke County Hospital 
District, August 9, 1994.

Lest I be misquoted, I have 
typed this statement, and I will 
read it aloud where all of you 
may hear.

I am in my third or fourth 
term as director, and have 
been Vice-President of this 
board for most of the time.

I have tried to be faithful in 
attendance to board meet­
ings, and have tried to be 
available in case of any emer­
gency.

I have tried to fulfill my re­
sponsibility to the tax payers 
who elected me to represent 
them on this board. I have 
tried to be faithful to their 
trust. In Ignorance, I have 
made many mistakes, but it 
was through ignorance and 
not Intentionally.

From the time this board 
voted to place Candy as As­
sistant Administrator, (with 
opposition, and the minutes 
of a prior meeting of this board 
will show, and by whom the 
opposition came) I have been 
taking flack from many people 
who ask, "WHY DO WE NEED 
AN ASSISTANT ADMINIS­
TRATOR?" and, "HOW MUCH 
ARE YOU PAYING HER?" On 
each occasion, I have asked 
them, "WHY DON'T YOU GO 
TO THE OTHER BOARD 
MEMBERS?" and their re­
sponse has been, "YOU ARE 
THE ONLY ONE WHO WILL 
LISTEN."

Since Sondra has been 
hired, I have had much, much, 
flack from many of the taxpay­
ers. Some have said, "I WISH I 
HAD VOTED AGAINST THE 
BOND ISSUE." These com­
plaints are coming from those 
who support the nursing 
home with their prayers and 
their presence when needed.

Some four or five years ago, 
I made a motion that nothing 
be purchased, (WITH THE 
EXCEPTIONS OF NECESSI­
TIES W ITHO UT THE 
BOARD'S APPROVAL, AND 
THE PROPOSAL TO PUR­
CHASE BE IN THE HANDS 
OF THE BOARD OF DIREC­
TORS FIVE DAYS PRIOR TO 
THE MEETING. This Motion 
died without a second. Now

THE TOWN & COUNTRY DIFFERENCE

An Employee Owned Company
A CAREER CHOICE W ITH A DIFFERENCE

TOWN & COUNTRY offers outstanding benefits including 
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THE TOWN & COUNTRY DIFFERENCE

we find ourselves in debt well 
over one-hundred thousand 
dollars, when at that time we 
were operating in the black 
with a good cushion so we 
could do what was needed to 
be done without b e in g  
cramped financially.

I serve all of you notice that I 
will do all within my power out­
side this board to bring about 
some changes here in this in­
stitution.

It is the policy of this institu­
tion that all those who resign 
so state in a written letter. I 
therefore give you my resig­
nation from this board as of 
now.

I pray God will open your 
eyes to what is going on here. 
May God bless you all.

I am happy you are my 
friends.

R. W. Blackmon

City officials 
attend three 
day meeting

Mayor Jackie Walker, Mayor 
Pro-tern Beth Prather, Coun­
cil-member John Conley, and 
C ouncil-m em ber K e lly  
Nichols, were in Amarillo July 
28 - July 31 to attend the 29th 
Annual Institute for Mayors, 
Council-members, and Com­
missioners. The three-day 
meeting provided an oppor­
tunity for municipal officials to 
attend workshops addressing 
current municipal issues. In 
addition, the Institute offered 
a chance to visit with elected 
officials from across Texas to 
learn how other cities are 
coping with the challenges 
facing municipal government 
today.

During the meeting. Insti­
tute attendees were offered a 
number of sessions on eco­
nomic development strate­
gies, law enforcement, infras­
tructure planning and im­
provements, and financial 
forecasting. In addition, 
roundtable discussion groups 
were held to allow for an in­
formal exchange of informa­
tion among municipal officials 
from cities of a similar size.

John Sharp , Texas 
Comptroller of Public Ac­
counts, addressed the Insti­
tute delegates at the Friday 
Opening General Session.

Mr. Sharp provided delegates 
with an overview of the 
"Forces of Change" report 
prepared by the Comptroller's 
office.

U. S. Senator Kay Bailey 
Hutchison spoke at Satur­
day's delegate luncheon. 
Senator Hutchison gave the 
Institute delegates insight into 
some of the issues facing 
Congress this year.

Jackie Walker, Mayor of 
Robert Lee, moderated a 
round table breakfast for small 
cities.

More than 600 elected offi­
cials attended the meeting. 
The meeting was sponsored 
by the Association of Mayors, 
Council-members, and Com­
missioners, an affiliate of the 
Texas Municipal League. The 
League is a voluntary 
association of over 1000 
Texas cities. The city of 
Robert Lee is a member of the 
Texas Municipal League.

Bryan, Davis 
Exchange Vows

Teri Bryan of Burleson and 
Frank Bryan of Austin an­
nounce the marriage of their 
mother, Prescilla Wylie Bryan 
to Stanley Craig Davis.

The double ring ceremony 
was performed by the Rev. 
Rex Boggs of Eastland in the 
Gunsight Baptist Church, 
Gunsight, Texas on August 6, 
1994.

Honor attendants for the 
couple were the b r id e 's  
daughter, Teri Bryan and 
Debbie Fade of Denver Col­
orado, daughter of the groom. 
The bride was accompanied 
and given in marriage by her 
son, Frank Bryan.

For something old the bride 
carried a lace handkerchief 
which belonged to her late 
grandmother, Mrs. T. M. 
Wylie, Sr., borrowed from her 
aunt, Dorothy Wylie Brown. 
Her dress was something new 
and for blue a garter made by 
her mother, Mary May Wylie.

Mrs. Davis, daughter of Mary 
May Wylie of Robert Lee and 
the late T. M. Wylie Jr, is office 
manager of an insurance of­
fice in San Angelo. Mr. Davis 
is the son of Mr. and Mrs. Ter­
rell J. Davis of Breckenridge, 
Texas.

GLENN-BIVINS INSURANCE 

Home, Auto, Life, and Health

123 W. Main Bronte 473-6791

Revival Services
August 17-21

Northside Church of Christ 
9th & Chadbourne 

Robert Lee
Evangelist 

Gene Shelburne 
of Amarillo^ Texas

Services: 7:30 pm 
Wednesday thru Saturday 

10:00 am & 2:00 pm Sunday
We cordially invite you to come 
and share with us in worship, 

praise, and fellowship.



The Observer/Enterprise Friday, August 19, 1994 Page 3

Parmer-Jacobs
nuptials held

Rhonda Parmer of San An­
gelo and Jim Bob Jacobs of 
Winters were married July 9, 
1994 in Junction at the First 
United Methodist Church. 
John Janicek officiated.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Rick Parmer of 
Bellville and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Jacobs of Robert Lee.

Matron of Honor was D'Ann 
Hunt of San Angelo, sister of 
the bride. Maid of honor was 
Carrie Parmer of Bellville, sis­
ter of the bride. Bridesmaid 
was Kim Hastings of San An­
gelo.

Best man was John Jacobs, 
fa ther of the groom. 
Groomsmen were Cory Smith 
of San Angelo and Richard 
Jacobs of Eldorado, brother 
of the groom.

Ushers were Randy Hunt of 
San Angelo and John Janicek 
of Bellville.

Mrs. Jacobs is a 1990 grad­
uate of Sam Rayburn High 
School in Pasadena and is at­
tending Angelo State Univer­
sity.

Her husband is a 1986 
graduate of Robert Lee High 
School. He received a bach­
elor's degree in Kinesiology 
from Angelo State University 
and is employed by the Win­
ters Independent School Dis­
trict.

After a wedding trip to Rui- 
doso, NM the couple is resid­
ing in Winters.

RL Open House 
Aug. 23

The faculty and administra­
tion of Robert Lee ISD with 
the assistance of the Robert 
Lee PTA are hosting an Open 
House, Tuesday, August 23, 
from 7:00 pm to 8:00 pm. The 
parents are encouraged to at­
tend and visit with their stu­
dent’s teachers about the 
coming school year. Each 
teacher will be in their as­
signed classroom. A fte r 
visitation refreshments will be 
served in the school cafeteria 
compliments of the Robert 
Lee PTA. .

The school district will also 
host a reception during the 
Open House in honor of Vir­
ginia Garlington who retired in 
June as Lunchroom Supervi­
sor of Robert Lee ISD. The 
reception will be, naturally, in 
the cafeteria. Parents, teach­
ers, students, and friends are 
encouraged to stop and say 
"thank you" for her years of 
service to our school and 
community.

LOOK WHO'S NEW!
Kimberly Michelle Lee

Kimberly Michelle Lee is the 
new daughter of Kerry and 
Heather Lee of Bronte.

She was born on Monday, 
August 8, 1994 at Shannon 
Hosptial in San Angelo, and 
weighed 7 lbs. and 15 oz. and 
was 18 inches long.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Wendall Lee of Winters 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ted Graham 
of Fabens.

Great-grandparents includp 
Mrs. Bertie Rae Lee of 
Ballinger, and Mr. and Mrs. A. 
Z. Denman of Bronte.

Personal
Gary Cloud of San Angelo, 

husband of the former Jill 
Strickland of Bronte received 
a B. A. degree from Angelo 
State University last friday 
night August 12.

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Bob Jacobs

Sunny 
Notes for 

_  the Coke 
County 
Seniors

Fuel Assistance 
Tom Green Community Ac­

tion Council will have a repre­
sentative in Bronte again on 
Wednesday, August 24th to 
help pay your electric bill. You 
will need to provide a billing 
history for one year, which 
you can obtain from WTU, so­
cial security numbers for ev­
eryone living in your house­
hold, your unpaid original bill, 
income verification, and an I. 
D. Thelma should be at the 
Center by 11:30 am.
Potiuck Luncheon 

Doors open at 9:00 for 
dominoes or "88" and a won­
derful luncheon at 11:30, on 
Thursday, August 25th.
Bingo in Robert Lee 

The Bronte Senior Citizens 
have been invited to go to 
Robert Lee on Thursday, Au­
gust 25th at 6:00 pm for a light 
supper and a fun evening of 
BINGO. Bring a small Bingo 
gift with you. Call the Bronte 
Senior Center if you are plan­
ning on going so we can give 
them a number count. HAVE 
FUN!
■Free Glaucoma Testing . 
Thursday. August 25th 

Texas Society to Prevent 
Blindness will have a techni­
cian at the Bronte Sen io r 
Center for free g laucom a 
screenings. She will begin at 
9:15. Please call the Bronte 
Center for an appointment. It 
doesn't hurt and only takes a 
few minutes. Bring your 
neighbor with you.

Menu for the Week 
Monday, August 22

Baked Ham, Scalloped Pota­
toes, Green Beans, Hot Roll, 
Sweet Potato Pie. 
Wednesday, August 24
Baked Pork Chops w/gravy. 
Mashed Potatoes, Seasoned 
Carrots, Hot Roll, Peach Cob­
bler
Friday, August 26
Spanish Meatballs, Green 
Beans, Cornbread, Potato 
Salad, Vanilla Pudding
ECCH Board meets
The Board of Directors of 

East Coke County Hospital 
met last Tuesday night, Au­
gust 9, at the Bronte Nursing 
Home for their regular monthly 
meeting.

LeDrew Arrott, president, 
presided at the meeting. Rev. 
R. W. Blackmon gave the in­
vocation. Secretary Eddie 
Alexander read the minutes of 
last month's meeting.

Discussion was held con­
cerning the new budget, and 
plans for adding 12 new pa­
tient rooms to the present fa­
cility.

The consideration of the 
salary for a new computer op­
erator was tabled until the 
next monthly meeting.

Rev. Blackmon submitted 
his resignation from the Board 
of Directors.

The meeting was ad­
journed.

Salinaz-Roach
engagement
announced

Christy Salinaz of Miles and 
Jerald Roach of San Angelo 
will exchange wedding vows 
August 20 at 3:00 pm in St. 
Joseph's Catholic Church in 
Rowena. Miss Salinaz is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Tino 
Salinaz of Miles. Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Roach of Lee, Florida 
and Mrs. Debbie Bradberry of 
Burleson are the parents of 
the prospective bridegroom. 
He is the grandson of the late 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Tom Roach of 
Robert Lee.

LIUESTOCK PRODUCERS
You are invited to a program on 

iivestock nutrition by 
Dr. John Buser,

DVM /Nutrition Advisor.
Learn to get more vaiue from your dry 
range conditions as weil as in good times.

Monday, August 22 - 6:30 pm 
New Rec Hall - Robert Lee 

MEAL SERVED - Please RSVP to Larry 
Jameson, 453-2939 by Sunday,

August 21, 3:00 pm

LARRY JAMESON - HLS FEED TUBS

Super H

IGA
LIMIT

RIGHTS

r  RESERVED

Sfll .. .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . IX
store Hrs: Mon>Sat 8-0 Sun. .8^6

...g p O R  „ ...

O'Henry

Peaches
Lb. /]L Cl

m w

Juicy

N ectarines

Rainbow Short Cut

Green 
Beans

4/$116 oz.
can

min Asst,

Bath

Pepper
2.69t2 pk.

12 oz. cans
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ROBERT LEE SCHOOL NEWS
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RL classes of '50-'70 reunion detailed
A reunion of the classes of 

RLHS graduating in 1950- 
1970, was held August 12-14 
at the Holiday Inn Convention 
Center Hotel, San Angelo. 
Anyone who attended these 
classes at anytime, their 
spouses or dates were invit-

Friday afternoon and 
evening was a re-get-ac- 
quainted time with a dinner. 
Saturday several classes had 
get togethers, while others 
just had a day of shopping 
and visiting.

Saturday evening a recep­
tion was held with D o c  
(Ronnie) Sims at the piano 
and (Dr.) Don Weathers on 
the sax.

Following dinner Vernay 
Vaughan Lomas led the 
group in the school song. 
Fran Wylie Lomas welcomed 
the group and reported 555 
members of the classes had 
been located with 165 in at­
tendance.

Garland Davis remembered 
those who had passed away.

A humorous review of the 
school years was given by 
William Hood, followed by 
Mary Vaughan Bessent's re­
port of the changes since the 
1950's.

The program was complet­
ed by Don Weathers, getting 
"The Disease called Child­
hood" with his own memories.

A dance followed with 
Sammie Duncan and the 
Country Kings.

A buffett breakfast w as 
served the following morning 
before the group adjourned.

Those in attendance were:
1950 - Joyce McCutchen 

Hood, San Angelo;
1951 - Don Hamilton and 

wife, Barbara, Midland; Wel­
don "Jiggs" Lofton, Baytown; 
Bobby Hood, San Angelo; 
Copey Davis, and wife, Jean, 
Dallas; Elwood Snyder, 
Frankston; Dean Richards 
Percifull, Robert Lee;

1 952 - Rhonda Farris 
Lofton, Baytown; S ondra 
Hester, Joan Hester Davis and

SCHOOL 
MENU

RL Lunch Menu
Monday, August 22
Burritos, Buttered Corn, 
French Fries, Brownies, Milk 
Tuesday, August 23 
Steak Fingers w/gravy. 
Creamed Potatoes, Buttered 
Carrots, Rolls w /butter. 
Pineapple Tidbits, Milk 
Wednesday, August 24 
Barbecue Rib-A-Ques on a 
Bun w/pickles. Macaroni & 
Cheese, Mixed Peas and 
Carrots, Peach Cobbler, Milk 
Thursday, August 25 
Spaghetti and Meat Sauce, 
Green Beans, Salad, Fruit 
Cocktail, Breadsticks 
Friday, August 26 
Hot Dogs w/chili & cheese. 
Pork & Beans, Tator Tots, 
Pears, Milk

Thelma Jo Hinnard, and friend 
Lloyd Sevier, all of Robert 
Lee;

1953 - Joyce King Walker, 
Odessa; Garland Davis, Bob­
by Roberts, Milburn Wink, Bill 
and Pat Hennington Carwile, 
all of Robert Lee;

1 954 - Bobby Walker, 
Odessa; Hollis Lloyd, and 
Barbara, Austin; LaRue Walk­
er Robertson, Lindsay, OK; 
Thomas Lee Ann Adelle, San 
Angelo; Dorene Harmon 
Mashburn, and Wayne, Dale 
Wojtek, Carlton Caston and 
Leta, Robert Lee;

1955 - Bonita Robertson 
Hester and Kenneth, Rock- 
port; Shirley Stewart Bailey, 
Mineral Wells; Victor Collett, 
Valera; Ben Bessent, Jeffie 
Harmon Roberts, Sherman 
Williams, Robert Lee;

1956 - Wanda W a lk e r 
Caulder, Abilene; Rose Marie 
Sawyer Davis, Sue Henson, 
Wojtek, Jackie Sparks Walker, 
Tommy Hood, Robert Lee;

1957 - Jo Alice Hufstedler, 
Ft. Worth; Jerry Harmon and 
Janie, Big Spring; Larry Jack 
Rabb and Mary Lou, Harlin­
gen; Carol Geer Richardson, 
Floresville; Mary Beth 
Schooler Snyder, Athens; 
Robbie Don Godwin, 
Houston; Sammie and Nancy 
Fulkerson Duncan, Donald 
Walker and Janis, Sharon 
Hester Arnold, San Angelo; 
Mary Vaughan Bessent, 
Richard Johnson, J u n e  
McKinley Gulley, Robert Lee.

1958 - Tommy "Hoot" Gib­
son, St. John, AZ; Pat Sey­
mour Collett, Valera; Frankie 
Wojtek and Betty, Eden; 
Monty Trimble, Corsicana; 
Dale Dean, Quitman; Freddy 
McDaniel, Doris Sparks Fox, 
San Angelo; Judy Allen 
Williams, Tom and Gay Hollis 
Sawyer, Robert Lee.

1959 - Johnnie Jones and 
friend, Leve lta  Sm ith, 
Christoval; Marta Geer Brooks, 
Austin; Don Stewart, Cedar 
Hill; Kenney Sawyer Sims, 
Houston; Curtis and Annice 
Gartrrian Walker, Marlow Wo­
jtek and Paula, Shirley Sparks 
Thomas, Wynn Weathers, 
San Angelo; Mike and Fran 
Wylie Lomas, Robert Lee.

19 60 - Ronnie S im s , 
Houston; Don Weathers and 
Mary, Austin; Sandy Roe 
Caves and Clint, Farmers 
Branch; Lavina McDaniel, 
Bedford; Jerry Dale Sparks 
Colburn Lubbock; J o h n  
Walker and Linda, San Ange-

lo; Jimmy Bell, Robert Lee.
1961 - David and Louise 

Sparks Drennan, Ft. Sumter, 
NM; Connie Mazilyn Weathers 
Hobaugh and Al, Canadian, 
OK; Vicki Wojtek Trimble, 
Corsicana; Richard Sims, 
James Blankenship, Lufkin; 
Gayle Lewis Moseley and Joe, 
Miles; Sue Parker Eaton, 
Abilene; Donnie Robertson, 
Robert Lee.

1962 - Don Hester, Abi­
lene; Bill Ledbetter and Roni, 
Texas City; Joe Roe and 
Brenda; Betty McGinley 
Drennan, and Bill, San Ange­
lo; Royce Hood, Robert Lee.

1963 - Carol Hester Morri­
son, and friend Glenn Whit­
tington, Roanoke; Clark Bod- 
win, Vancover, WA; Dwain 
Walker, Hurst; Joe Lara, Abi­
lene; Lexie Lewis Hollway and 
Bob, Prescilla Wylie Davis, 
San Angelo; Beverly Higgin­
botham Bell and Frankie Milli- 
can Hood, Robert Lee.

1964 - Bill Roach, Bedford; 
Elaine Robertson Bennett, 
Arlington; Elwanda Sparks 
Jones, San Angelo; John and 
Jeanette Higginbotham Ja­
cobs, Robert Lee.

1965 - Jo Alice Evans Par- 
tain and Jimmy, Abilene; 
Shirley Roe Powell and Ken­
neth, San Angelo; Ruth 
McGinley Robertson, Robert 
Lee.

1966 - William and Rhonda 
(Gartman) Hood, Robert Lee.

1967 - Johnnie McDonald 
Vance, DeQueen, AR; Kathy 
Preslar Butler and James, 
Sweetwater; Bob Lomas, 
Longview; Anna Lopez Lara, 
Abilene; Rinda Wojtek, Buddy 
Vosburg, San A n g e lo ;  
Suzann Burns Johnson, 
Robert Lee.

1968 - Vernay Vaughan 
Lomas, Longview; Wannice 
Yarborough Abalos, Amarillo.

1969 - Steve and Debra 
Vosburg Rives, San Angelo; 
David Roe and friend Sandy 
McComb, Robert Lee.

1970 -Lavina  Yarbrough 
Willoughby and friend. Jay 
Rivera, Edgecliff V illage; 
Doug Burns and Mariane, 
Iraan; Mike Bagwell, Robert 
Lee.

From other classes -
1971 Tony Abalos, Amarillo; 
Christie Roach Bagwell, 
Robert Lee; Pat Lewis and 
Cindy, San Angelo; Jerri Mc­
Donald Smith. Class of 1974 - 
Phyllis Wojtek Murphy and 
Gaylon of Mesquite.

School is 
back in 

session-so 
please, 
DRIVE

CAREFULLY!

BELL AUTO PARTS
Robert Lee 453-2911

Blake Payne was one of two students cho­
sen statewide to speak to the TS&G Assn, 
during their conference in Kerrvilie on Friday, 
July 16. Over 500 members attended includ­
ing Texas Agriculture Commissioner Rick Perry 
and Executive Secretary of TS&G and Texas 
Senator Bill Sims. Blake Is a senior at RLHS 
and a member of Coke County 4-H.

RL School News
The Robert Lee Steers 

football team begins its sea­
son this week. The firs t 
scrimmage is set for Thursday, 
August 18 at Robert Lee 
where the Steers will meet 
Ozona. The Steers are ready 
for another great year.

Manning the concession 
stand during the home foot­
ball games will be Project 
Graduation 1995 parents as 
well as members of the senior 
class. Proceeds from this ef­
fort will go to project gradua­
tion events during the coming 
year. Originally begun as 
drug-free, alcohol-free after 
Graduation party. Project 
Graduation has proved to be 
an event that seniors look

forward to all year. Seniors 
1995 and parent organizers 
for project graduation 1995 
are planning a year long 
agenda of drug-free alcohol 
free activities. The S teer 
concession stand will be 
stocked and ready Thursday. 
Menu items include. Brisket 
sandwiches, Frito Pie, Na- 
chos. Chips, and all the rest. 
See you at the game.

Correction
Ms. Debra Reed of San An­

tonio, an interviewer for posi­
tions at the Wackenhut Job 
Fair last week, was misidenti- 
fied as Debra Reed Walker in a 
picture on page 1 of the Ob­
server/Enterprise. The 
newspaper regrets the error.

W INK INSURANCE AGENCY
H o m e *A u to

L ife * H e a ith * C o m m e r c ia l  

715 Austin - 453-4551

VO u R/ mndiptndem ilmmnifMACBNT

Texas Cellular has increased your local calling scope 
to cover the Lone Star State!

You can now call anywhere in the State of Texas and you will not 
be charged a toll charge.

That^s right!
Call El Paso, Brownsville, Beaumont, or Dalhart - all you pay is 

your airtime! Texas Cellular will pick up 
the tab for your long distance.

No matter what plan you are on, the long distance calls to any 
point in the State of Texas are F R E E *

TEXAS
CELLULAR.
A service of Taylor Telecommunicafions, Inc.

C a l l . ^
Anytime.

*Apf>lies to home area only. Any calls made while roaming will be charged at roaining rates.

2403 w î s t h  Street 
(915)573-2424

Roy Bldr, Agent 
Robert Lee 
824 Austin 

(915)453-2380

Sweetwater 
1901 Bristol 

(915)235-4377



1994 BHS Football Schedule
DATE OPPONENT SITE TIME
August 25 Eden (Scrimmage) Here 6:00
Sept. 2 Cross Plains There 8:00
Sept. 9 Miles Here 8:00
Sept. 16 Roby There 8:00
Sept. 23** Santa Anna Here 8:00
Sept. 30 Menard There 8:00
Oct. 7* Robert Lee Here 7:30
Oct. 14* Roscoe There 7:30
Oct. 21* Garden City Here 7:30
Oct. 28* Sterling City There 7:30
Nov. 4* Water Valley Here 7:30

‘ District Games
Homecoming

Lady Horn Volleyball
DATE OPPONENT

August 20 Snyder/Plains (JV/V)
August 23 Sweetwater (9/JV/V)
August 26/27 Odessa Tournament (V) 
August 30 Abilene High (9/JV/V)
Sept. 2/3 Central Tournament (V)
Sept. 6 Central (9/JV/V)
Sept. 10 Lake View Tournament (JV)
Sept. 13 Lake View (9/JV/V)
Sept. 17 Colorado City Tournament (V)
Sept. 20 Snyder (9/JV/V)
Sept. 24 Albany (JV/V)
Sept. 27 Colorado City (9/JV/V)
*Oct. 4 Santa Anna (JV/V)
*Oct. 8 Miles (JV/V)
*Oct. 11 Water Valley (JV/V)
*Oct. 15 Santa Anna (JV/V)
*Oct. 22 Miles (JV/V)
*Oct. 25 Water Valley (JV/V)
‘ District

Schedule
TIME 

11:00
SITE
There
There
There
Here
There
Here
There
Here
There
There
There
There
Here
There
Here
There
Here
There

5:00
TBA
5:30
TBA
5:00
TBA
5:00
TBA
5:00
12:00
5:00
6:00
2:00
6:00
2:00
2:00
6:00
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BRONTE SCHOOL NEWS

Spring Retreat 
P la n n e d

First Baptist Church has 
planned a Spring Retreat Ski 
Trip to Purgatory, Colorado 
March 13-17, 1995. Bobby 
Kacal, youth minister, says it's 
early but reservations must be 
made now to assure a quality 
trip and a reasonable price.

Youth that have completed 
6th grade may participate, as 
well as children with parents.

SCHOOL
MENU

Bronte Breakfast 
Menu

Monday, Aug. 22
Breakfast Pizza, Orange 
Juice, Milk
Tuesday, Aug. 23
Cereal, Diced Pears, Toast, 
Milk
Wednesday, Aug. 24
Oatmeal, Grape Juice, Cinna­
mon Toast, Milk 
Thursday, Aug. 25 
Scrambled Eggs, A p p le  
Juice, Biscuits, Milk 
Friday, Aug. 26 
Cereal, Diced Peaches, 
Toast, Milk
Bronte Lunch Menu
Monday, Aug. 22
Pizza, Buttered Corn, Tossed 
Salad, Milk, Chocolate Pud­
ding
Tuesday, Aug. 23
Chicken Fried Steak w/gravy. 
Creamed Potatoes, Green 
Beans, Rolls, Milk, Diced 
Pears
Wednesday, Aug. 24
Hot Dogs w/chili & cheese, 
Tator Tots, Pork & Beans, 
Bun, Milk, Pink Panther Cake 
Thursday, Aug. 25 
Spaghetti w/meat sauce. 
Tossed Salad, Diced Peach­
es, Bread Sticks, Milk 
Friday, Aug. 26 
Chick-Fil-A Sandwich, Ranch 
Style Beans, Cole Slaw, Bun, 
Milk, Orange

I PARKER PLUMBING
Residential-Commercial 

All Types Plumbing Repair

*New Construction 
♦Remodeling 
♦Fixtures 
♦Sewer Service

Licensed Master Plumber

473-2131 Bronte

Watermelon to 
be served after

scrimmage
Parents of the Bronte 

Longhorn football team will 
serve watermelon after the 
Eden scrimmage in Bronte on 
August 25, to all parents, stu­
dents, players, coaches, 
families, and supporters.

Come out and support our 
kids. The invitation is extend­
ed to persons in both Bronte 
and Eden.

Please call Bobby Kacal at 
473-2331 or 473-5600 for 
more information.

End of summer Fun 
Night for

Methodist youth
Methodist Fun Night came 

to a close with a party at the 
Bronte City Park. After a hot 
dog cookout and the trim­
mings, Keith and Vicki Mc- 
Cutchen provided the enter­
tainment with Frisbee Golf. 
Eighteen children and 1 2 
adults participated in the fun 
evening. Our purpose for the 
summer program was to give 
the school age children a fun 
evening of fellowship and 
learning experiences. We 
had puppets, a magician, 
videos, crafts each evening 
and games. Dianne Luckett 
was the leader and her assis­
tants were Pat Martindale, Pat 
Lee, Kay Robbins, Glenda 
Draper, Mary Percifull, Jodi 
Hilliard, Joni and Brittany Bar­
rett, and Keith and Vicki Mc- 
Cutchen.

Direct Deposit

EQUAL HOUSING
LENDER

Many people have 
their Social 

Security or other 
Government 
checks sent 

directly to our 
bank where it is 

credited 
immediately to 

their account. No 
chance of loss or 

theft and your 
money can begin 
earning interest 

immediately.

Stop in and let us 
help you fill out a 

request for "Direct 
Deposit". There is 

no extra charge 
for this service.

51 Robert Lee 
^  State Bank

Member FDIC

Over 50 youth and adults participated in the 
Back to School Retreat sponsored by First 
Baptist Church August 5, 6, and 7.

BJH
DATE 

Sept. 19 
Sept. 26 
Oct. 3 
Oct. 10 
Oct. 17 
Oct. 24

Volleyball
OPPONENT 
Santa Anna 
Water Valley 
Miles
Santa Anna 
Water Valley 
Miles

Schedule
SITE
There
There
Here
Here
Here
There

TIME
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00
5:00

BJH
DATE 

Sept. 8 
Sept. 15 
Sept. 22 
Sept. 29 
Oct. 6 
Oct. 13 
Oct. 20 
Oct. 27 
Nov. 3

Football
OPPONENT

Miles Scrimmage 
Roby
Santa Anna 
Menard 
Robert Lee 
Roscoe 
Garden City 
Sterling City 
Water Valley

Schedule
SITE
There
Here
There
Here
There
Here
There
Here
There

TIME
6:00
6:00
6:00
6:00
6:00
6:00
6:00
6:00
6:00

Welcome to our family...

F < u n ily A fF a ir
W aNOEU) OOMMUNITY HOSPITAL

Cenui A Special center dedicated
to women and their health needs.

THEMAlfCdNNEOION
An exciting, educational program created 

exclusively for men of ull ages.

CKiU^h5 CtNTf r
Angelo Community Hospital's specialized pediatrics unit named for 

longtime San Angelo pediatrician Dr. Ralph Chase.

) y h f l i x b  The unicpte, fun'filled club for anyone who delivers a  baby 
at Angelo Community. Pre^registration is required. For 
more information, call 949-9511, ext. 130.

Since 1929, Anijelo Community has taken care of the 
health needs of generations of West Texans. Now there’s 

another reason to join the Community family.

F iu n U y ^ f fa lr '
irrANGSU) OOMMLWnV HOSPITAL

A Family Affair is a new, innovative family of educational programs 
designed especially with your/ami/y in mind.

From wellness classes to teach you how to keep everyone in your family 
healthy to the latest information on medical issues and procedures,

A Family Affair gives you what you expect.

Only The Best
ANGELO

m
COMMUNITY HOSPITAL

For more information about Angelo (community’s A Family A ffair 
program, contact The Women’s CAnter at 949-9511, ext. 130.

Angelo Community Hospital • 3501 Knickeibocker •  San Angelo
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BU Y IT. 
SELL IT. 
FIN D  IT.

C L A S S I F I E D
FOR SALE

CLASSIFIED 
ADVERTISING RATES

1st. Insertion...
20c Per Word 

($3.00 Minimum) 
2nd. and Subsequent 
Insertions...

16c Per Word 
($2.50 Minimum)

Additional 50c 
for Blind Ads 

Cards/Thanks...
20c Per Word

Legal Notices...
20c Per Word

COPY DEADLINE
Class Ads..5 pm Tues. 

Display Ads..5 pm Tues. 
Classified Ads & Cards of 

Thanks are payable in 
ADVANCE unless customer 
carries regular account.

C FOR SALE 1

Elaine Lee 
4 5 3 - 2 9 9 5  
Laura E. Crenshaw 
4 5 3 - 2 7 6 1

3 BR HOUSE, 2 BA. central 
heat & air, numerous extras, 
well-kept, large corner lot, 
trees, sprinkler system, 
garage, patio, and storage 
buildings.

Mobile Home on 4 lots in 
Robert Lee.
3 LOTS on east side Hwy. 
158
BRICK 3BR/2 BA TH , lo­
cated on large lot, double car­
port and storage building.

EdOAL HOUSIHC
o p p o r t u n i t y

GREAT BUILDING SITE
86 Acres w/river frontage. Call 
Jewell Real Estate, 658-7549 
or Nell 453-4355. 
_____________02a-4tc

SALE SALE SALE
New 1995 sixteen wide three 
bedroom mobile home deliv­
ered to your site only $17,774 
or just $189.00 per month. 
Quantity limited so call today. 
Call 915-676-2043, Lone Star 
Housing, (based on 10% 
down, 180 months, 11.75% 
APR, lendor approval re­
quired).
_____________01 q-4tc

FOR SALE BY OWNER
3 BR/2 BA brick home in 
Bronte, 2 lots, double garage. 
Call for appointment. 473- 
2409 or 947-7182. 
_____________03-4tc

FOR SALE 
Bronte

Owner said " R e d u c e  
Price" 3 BR/2 1/2 BA, extra 
large.

Robert Lee

Residential lots ready for
construction.

Large home plus more!
New to market, call for details.

ADAMS LAND & 
REALTY CO.

Phone 453-2723 or 
655-9429

Elsie Adams 453-2757

HOUSE FOR SALE 
BY OWNER

805 W. 11th, 1610 square 
feet. 3BR/2BA, CH/A, privacy 
fence, newly rem o de led  
kitchen, call 453-4630. 
_____________45-tnc

3 BEDROOM HOUSE
with pecan trees on 50 X 140 
lot for sale in Bronte. 915- 
473-3601.
_____________02-4tc

FOR SALE
1986 FI 50 Supercab. Red, 
captain seats, excellent 
condition. See at FNB, 
Bronte, or call 473-6121. 
_____________03b-tnc

NEW SHIPMENT
hand turned pottery, new 

patterns. Come in and check 
it out. Hometown Hardware, 
Bronte, Texas. 
_____________03b-2tc

1991 BASSSPORTS 
BOAT

48 HP, Evenrude, depth 
finder, live well, captain seats, 
blue and silver metallic. 473- 
4100.
_____________02b-4tP

COMFORTABLE
2BR/1BA

home with shade trees. Mo­
bile home at rear of property 
for guests or rental. Call Jew­
ell Real Estate, 658-7549 or 
Nell, 453-4355. 
--------------------Q2a-3tc

SHAFFER 
FUNERAL HOME
BRONTE ROBERT LEE

473-3131 453-2424
M O N U M E N T S

Duplications 
____ Custom Designs

1994 DOUBLEWIDE 
CLEARANCE SALE

New Redman 4 bedroom 
doublewide, 28 x 76 reduced 
thousands for model clear­
ance sale - only $39,599 de­
livered to your site. There's 
only one left at this price. 
Lone Star Housing, 915-676- 
2043.
_____________Q1a-4tc

3 1/2 TON CENTRAL AIR 
CONDITIONER

for mobile home. New motor 
and compressor. 453-4751 
after 5 pm.
_____________03-1tc

SUPER NICE BRICK 3 
BEDROOM, 2 BATH

near school. Call Jewell Real 
Estate 658-7549 or Nell 453- 
4355.
___________ Q2a-4tc

FOR SALE
brown, tweed Early American 
sofa, solid maple trim. Excel­
lent condition, $100. Call 
453-2470
_____________03-1tc

a  I f e w U
REAL ESTATE

APPRAISALS & PROPERTY MANAGEMENT

1319 S. Oakes 
San Angelo, TX 76903

N ELL K EN N ED Y  
A p p raiser/ R ealtor 
B u s. 915/658-7549 
R es . 915/453-4355

L FOR RENT 1
ONE OR TWO 

BEDROOM  
APARTMENTS 

FOR RENT
Taking applications Mon., 
Wed., and Fri., 9 am - 3 pm. 
Housing Authority of Robert 
Lee, 170 N. Bishop, 453- 
2912. Equal Housing Oppor­
tunity.
_____________16a-EOW

ROBERT LEE 
HOMES FOR LEASE

Plumbing renovations just 
completed. Both hom es 
available now. Call John 
Sage, 655-9141 or 655-0370 
after 9:30 pm.
________  01-tnc

BRONTE MINI STORAGE
located on West Main Street is 
now owned by Phillip and 
Martha Ratliff. Storage build­
ings are available, call 473- 
2221 or 473-2140.
____________ 02b-2tp

FOR RENT
One bedroom units at Bronte 
Housing authority. Apply at 
office 102 N. Washington, 
Bronte. Equal Housing 
Opportunity.
_____________Q1b-3tc

C M is e

WANT TO BUY
6 quart pressure cooker in 
good condition. Call 453- 
2301.
_____________03-2tP

Johnson’s 
Water Well 

Service
Farm

Ranch Home 
Windmills & Pumps 

24 HR. SERVICE
658 -6039or
655 -0379

"TEXAS BEST" 
CARPET CLEANING

professional service, truck 
mounted cleaning system. 
Serving all Coke County. Call 
toll free 1-800-473-2807 or 
473-2807, Bronte. Free es­
timates.
___________ 49-tnc

WINDOW UNITS
Donnie's Appliance. Time to 
service your window units 
residential and commercial, 
453-2188.
___________ 38-tnc

D & L DOZER SERVICE
Larry Spivey, Owner-Opera­
tor. PO Box 160, Bronte, TX. 
Phone (Oak Creek Lake) 915- 
743-2577.
________  21b-tnc

ROBERT LEE PROJECT 
GRADUATION 95

will man the concession stand 
during home football games. 
Come join us for the fun. 
_____________03-1tc

LOST
white and charcoal grey male 
neutered cat. Answers to 
name Macho. Disappeared 
from 513 S. Franklin, Bronte, 
last week. Reward, call 473- 
2160.
_____________03b-2tc

FOR PIANO & 
VOICE LESSONS

call Carolyn Long, 453-2383. 
Tutoring for some band in­
struments.
____________03-3tC

c GARAGE SALES j
GARAGE SALE

children's tennis shoe bed, 
couch, baby items, portable 
baby bed, clothes, kitchen 
items, fireplace tools, end ta­
bles, Friday 19th, Saturday 
20th, Sunday 21st. Lots 
more, from 8 am til? 506 
Southwest Railroad, Bronte. 
_____________03b-1tc

GARAGE SALE
car seat; baby, adult and chil­
dren's clothes: other baby 
items; dishes; knick-knacks 
and lots more. 821 Euel St.,
8:00 am - ? Saturday only, 
Robert Lee.
___________ Q3.:.llg

c NOTICES j

j

PUBLIC NOTICE
Notice is hereby given that a 

Budget Hearing will be held at 
6:45 pm on September 8, 
1994, in the City Hall, Bronte, 
Texas.

The Budget for the City of 
Bronte for the fiscal year 
October 1, 1994, to
September 30, 1995 will be 
adopted.

The public is invited to 
attend and participate in these 
proceedings.

Pat Martindale 
City Secretary 

_____________03b-1tc

ACCEPTING
APPLICATIONS AND/OR 

RESUMES
for position of Training Co-or- 
dinator/lnfection Control 
Nurse. Must be L. V. N. or R. 
N. Apply in person at 900 S. 
State, Bronte, or send 
resume to P. O. Drawer M, 
Bronte, TX, 76933. Equal 
opportunity employer. 
____________Q.3b-ltC

PUBLIC NOTICE
East Coke County Hospital 
dba Bronte Nursing Home 
Observes Title VI of the Civil 
Rights Act of 1964 and Sec­
tion 504 of the Rehabilitation 
Act of 1973.

No person shall, on the 
grounds of race, color, creed, 
sex, age, national origin or 
handicap, be excluded from 
participation in, be denied the 
benefit of, or be subjected to 
discrimination under anx pro­
gram activity, or employment.

This policy applies to all 
resident/recipients, person­
nel or any other individual 
having contracts or doing 
business with the facilities of 
East Coke County Hospital 
District.

LeDrew Arrott 
Board President 

Pam Stokes-Shaffer 
Administrator 

_____________03b-1tc

THE CITY OF ROBERT 
LEE HAS ADOPTED 

ORDINANCE NO. 1050 
TO BE EFFECTIVE 
OCTOBER 1, 1994: 
ORDINANCE 1050 

An ordinance of the City of 
Robert Lee, Texas, providing 
definitions; pertaining to the 
ownership, control and regu­
lation of animals in general; 
pertaining to the ownership, 
control and regulation of dogs 
and cats; providing for is­
suance and revocation of 
permits and licenses: provid­
ing for adoption of Chapter 
826 of the Texas Health and 
Safety Code concerning ra­
bies: repealing all ordinances 
or parts of ordinances in con­
flict therewith: providing a 
savings clause; finding and 
determining that the meetings 
at which the ordinance is 
passed are open to the public 
as required by law; providing 
for a penalty: providing for 
publication in the newspaper; 
and providing for an effective 
date.

The above is a caption of 
ordinance #1050. This ordi­
nance is available for inspec­
tion in its entirety at Robert 
Lee City Hall.
___________ 02a-2tc

ACCEPTING RESUMES 
& APPLICATIONS

for the position of a computer 
accounting programmer. Ap­
ply in person at 900 S. State, 
Bronte, or send resume to P. 
O. Drawer M, Bronte, TX, 
76933. Equal opportunity 
employer.
____________03b-1tc

PUBLIC NOTICE OF 
BUDGET HEARING

Notice is hereby given that a 
Budget Hearing will be held 
on Thursday, September 1, 
1994 at 5:00 pm in the Board 
Room at the West Coke 
County Hospital District Nurs­
ing Home in Robert Lee, 
Texas.

The budget for the fiscal 
year of October 1, 1994 
through September 30, 1995 
will be adopted.

Any taxpayer is invited to 
attend and participate in these 
proceedings.

Copies of the budget will be 
available upon request.

Don Baker 
Administrator

Hospital District
___________ Q3a-2tg

Pretzels were originally 
a Lenten food. Their twist­
ed shape suggested arms 
crossed in prayer.
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c NOTICES 1
THE CITY OF ROBERT

LEE HAS ADOPTED 
ORDINANCE NO. 1051 

TO BE EFFECTIVE 
OCTOBER 1, 1994: 
ORDINANCE 1051

An ordinance of the City of 
Robert Lee, Texas, providing 
definitions; pertaining to the 
licensing of itinerant vendors, 
solicitors or handbill dis­
tributors: providing for dura­
tion of licenses; providing for 
restrictions on itinerant ven­
dors, solicitors or handbill dis- 

Personal
Kimble Middleton of Robert 

Lee was seriously injured at 
Lake Spence July 26 where 
he dived into the water while 
swimming with friends. He 
sustained a broken neck 
when he struck a submerged 
ledge. He is wearing a halo 
device to stabilize the break.

An employee of the city, he 
returned to Robert Lee after 
his discharge from the service 
following Desert Storm. He 
will be inactive for at least two 
more months.

Personal
Roxie and Don Be lew of Big 

Spring were in Bronte last 
weekend when Roxie assist­
ed her parents Mr, and Mrs. 
Kenneth Campbell with their 
garage sale.

Germania Insurance

Covering Texas 
since 1896. 
Property, liability 
and life insurance

Bill Carwile 
4 5 3 - 2 5 2 2

Political Calendar 
The O bserver/ 

E n te rp r is e
has been authorized to make 

the following 
announcements for the 

political offices in 
Coke County.

Each candidate has paid for 
his or her announcement and 

will serve as their own 
campaign treasurer. All 

political advertising, 
announcements, and printing 

is cash in advance.
17TH

CONGRESSIONAL 
DISTRICT U.S. 

R EPR ESEN T A T IV E
Charles Stenholm

COUNTY & 
DISTRICT CLERK

Ettie Hubbard
COKE COUNTY 

JUDGE
Royce Lee

COKE COUNTY 
COMMISSIONER 

PRECINCT 2
Billy Joe Luckett

COKE COUNTY 
JUSTICE OF THE 

PEACE, PREC.
2, 4, & 5

Bruce Sonnenberg

tributors; providing for 
exemptions: repealing all or­
dinances or parts of ordi­
nances in conflict therewith; 
providing a savings clause; 
finding and determining that 
the meetings at which the or­
dinance is passed are open to 
the public as required by law; 
providing for a penalty; pro­
viding for publication in the 
newspaper, and providing for 
an effective date.

The above is a caption of 
ordinance #1051. This ordi­
nance is available for inspec­
tion in its entirety at Robert 
Lee City Hall.
_____________02a-2tc

Spence 
F is hin'

Water tem pera ture  - 84 
deg rees

Paint Creek Marina
Trav Cannon and J.P. Fisher. 
reeled in 4 stripers from 2 to 4 
lbs. on bass minnows.
Jason Fisher - Odessa, reeled 
in 9 stripers 20 lbs. total, top 
water fishing.
Keith Armstrong - Midland, 
reeled in a 14 lb., 1 oz. striper 
trolling.
Willie Justis and Tommy 
Clifton - Odessa, reeled in 12 
stripers, 32 lbs. total, trolling 
with white bucktail and jig. 
Trov Young and family - 
Hobbs, NM, limited on 
stripers, a total of 39 3/4 lbs.

Wildcat Marina 
Frank Hqrris - Midland, reeled 
in a 15 1/2 lb. striper on live 
shad.
Josh Brown - Odessa, reeled 
in a 15 1/2 lb. striper on live 
shad.
Terry Brown - Odessa, reeled 
in a 16 lb. striper on live shad. 
Terry Brown. Josh Brown, and 
Frank Harris - Odessa, reeled 
in 6 stripers, 82 lbs. total 
weight on live shad.

Tracey Waller

Bobby Kacal

Sheila Senkirik

EI Rancherò Restaurant
M exican -A m erican  Food  

Open Tues.-Sat. 11 am - 2 pm & 5-9 pm 
Open Sunday 11 am - 2 pm 

224 W. Main Bronte 473-2140

Shannon

HEALTH NOTES
White-Coat Hypertension

The jump in blood pressure that seems to occur only at a doc­
tor's office is called white-coat hypertension, and is usually not 
treated because of its apparent temporary nature. However, resear­
chers in Switzerland reported in the American Heart Association 
journal Hypertension (4-94) that white-coat hypertension might be 
an early warning sign of high blood pressure instead of just stress 
over having to visit a doctor,

They studied how salt is handled by the kidneys in people with 
normal blood pressure, high blood pressure and white-coat 
hypertension. The results suggest that patients with white-coat 
hypertension have kidney function very much like those with un­
treated high blood pressure. The Swiss researchers say the results 
may lead doctors to view white-coat hypertension as something 
other than an innocuous condition.

<&1992. Lyle Dean, Inc.
Shannon Health Notes is a public service of

JIL, Shannon MedicalCenter
120 East Harris • San Angelo,Texas • (91 5 )653-6741

BISD introduces 
new faculty

Tracy Waller will be teaching 
high school Spanish and Jr.
High English for the 1994-95 
school year.

Tracey attended W inters 
High School and graduated in 
1989. She continued her 
education at Angelo State 
University and Texas Tech 
University. She graduated 
from Texas Tech in December 
of 1993 with a Bachelor of 
Arts degree In English. Her 
husband, Corey, attends An­
gelo State University and an­
ticipates graduation next Au­
gust. They live in Bronte.

Bobby Kacal received his 
Bachelors degree from An­
gelo State University in Ele­
mentary Education, with en­
dorsements in Psychology, 
and Emotionally Disturbed.

His teaching assignments 
will include High School Re­
source, English and Reading.

Sheila Senkirik will b e 
teaching accounting, English 
I, II, and III at the high school.

Mrs. Senkirik was born and 
raised in Brownwood and re­
ceived a B. S. in English and 
Business Education from  
Howard Payne University.

She and her husband 
Bryan, have a three year-old 
son, Jake Ryan.

Peggy Kemp has been 
hired as Elementary Secretary 
for Bronte. She is married to 
Bobby D. Kemp, retired from 
El Paso Electric Co.

She has lived in Fabens, 
Texas since 1944, and at­
tended and graduated from 
Fabens ISD.

Mrs. Kemp Is presently a 
member of Montwood Church 
of Christ In El Paso.

Mrs. Kemp has been active 
in Girl Scouts and Fabens Ex­
tension Club. She worked for 
Fabens ISD for 18 years; 15 
years as high school secre­
tary, 1 1/2 years for Assistant 
Superintendent in the Per­
sonnel office, 1 1/2 years in 
Records Management in the 
businness office.

The Kemps have a daugh­
ter, Dana, who lives in Hurst, 
Texas with her two children, 
James and Meghan.

Bronte School 
Facu lty  & S ta ff 

1 9 9 4 - 9 5  
E le m e n ta ry  

Principal - Terry Myers 
Kindergarten - Carol White 
1st Grade - Susan Graves 
2nd Grade - Lisa Dyess 
2nd Grade - Lisa Turner 
3rd Grade - Cindy Bessent

PINOCCHIO'S 
PIZZA TRUCK

3rd Grade - Donna Poehls 
4th Grade - Linda Arrott 
4th Grade - Marty Blair 
5th Grade - Pat Lee 
6th Grade - Heather Lee 
Music - George Tomes 
Special Education - Carolyn 
Allen
Special Education - Merle 
Kelso
Gifted/Talented (K-12) - Wan­
da Brewer
P. E. - Russ Peterson 
Remedial Reading/Migrant (K- 
6) - Terri Rawls
Elementary Aide - C indy 
Tomes
Write-to-Read Aide - Brenda 
Hines
Librarian - Charlotte Tounget 
Secretary - Peggy Kemp 
Janitor - Christina Tapia 

High School 
Principal - Scott Turner 
Secretary - Nancy Jackson 
Terah Collins - Mathematics 
Wanda Brewer - English, Gift­
ed & Talented
Karen Fox - Reading, Athlet­
ics, Art
Jay Henderson - Agriculture 
Kerry Lee - Health, Athletics, 
History
Marifrances Mackey - Mathe­
matics, English, Gifted & Tal­
ented
Julie Massey - Home Eco­
nomics, Gifted & Talented 
Keith McCutchen - History, 
Athletics
Mary McMullan - Computers 
Rocky Rawls - History, Athlet­
ics
Sheila Senkirik - English, Gift­
ed & Talented
Jerlta Taylor - Science, Gifted 
& Talented 
George Tomes - Band 
Doug Tounget - Mathematics 
Lloyd Walker - Science 
Tracey Waller - English, 
Spanish, Gifted & Talented 
Russell Peterson - Athletics 
Chris Holden - S p e c ia l  
Education
Bobby Kacal - Special Educa­
tion
Ronda Moore - High School 
Aide
Carolyn Lee - Librarian 
Custodians - Frances Dyess 
and Rita Dauth 
Maintenance - Royce Dyess

Personal
Mrs. Don "Lorie" Hamilton and 
twin babies, Stinson and 
Parker of Midkiff were In 
Bronte last Tuesday and 
Wednesday when they visited 
Elmer, Janet, and Debbie 
Hurley, Sharon Kennedy and 
Mrs. Marie Strickland.

Any jackass can kick a 
barn down, but it takes a 
carpenter to build it.

S)

s i '

S|:

Will be in Robert Lee Tuesday at 
5:00 pm until sold out 

FOR SPECIAL ORDERS 
CALL IN TOLL FREE UNTIL 2:00 

ON TUESDAYS
1-800-725-6668

Single Topping
Medium Large

1 for $6.99 1 for $7.99
2 for $10.00 + tax 1 for $13.99

Specialty Pizza
1 for $8.99 1 for $9.99

2 for $13.99 + tax 2 for $16.99 + tax

WE HAVE PLENTY OF HOT PIZZA ON TRUCK 
Large Single Topping $9.00 Large Specialty $11.00
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Boneless

Chuck 
Roast

1 . 4 9

OF BRONTE

OPEN
7 Days a Week

STORE HOURS
Mon.-Sat. -7:30 am to 8 pm 

Sunday -  8 am to 7 pm

FOOD STAMPS WELCOME

B o ne less

Arm Roast

Extra Lean

Cube Steak
Lean

Ground
Chuck

Lb.

Lb.

Lb.

1 . 6 9 S teak

1 Q O  VeriB est M arket Sliced

■yy Chopped Ham

A r m o u r

“1 , 6 9 B o l o g n a

--------------------

v A v /f t / if
4 ^  ^  A rm our Breaded

C h i c k e n ^  

1 ,4 9 Nuggets^
^  5 . 9  9 ^

Lb.

B lackburn Made S h u r f  I ne

S y r u p
1 . 7 9

Picante Sauce
16 oz. Q  Q

J a r  ■
Charm in Space Maker

Bathroom Tissue
Friskies Come & Get it

D o g  F o o d
4 roll Q  Q  
pkg. ■ 5/ 5 Lb. 1 Q  Q

Bag 1 ■ W  W

Helm an's Real

Mayonnaise
S h u r f i n e

Shoestring Potatoes

■5.r 2 . 6 9 3 “ "  / $ 1

H ills h ire  Sm oked

Sausage Lb. 1 . 5 9
M rs. C ro ckett's M arket Made

Potato Pork
Salad Sausage

. 4 9 Lb . 9 9
Parade Medium & Large
Diapers 3 .9<

Dr. Pepper 
or Pepsi

'̂7 >

1 . 3 ^

f

Green Giant

Beans & 
Peas

300 Size 
can

4/.99
K o o l - A i d

Bursts
•“ 1 .3 9
Snackwell Double Fudge

Cookie Cakes
6 1/4 oz. 1 .4 9

S l i c e

Soft Drinks
ca“  1 . 3 9

Prem ium  S a ltin e

Crackers
1 Lb. Box 
Reg. only .99

Era Liquid

Laundry
D etergen t

50 oz. 2.39
Buying Groceries this 

Week?
If So - Try This

HOT CASH
front Hailes Super Save Food  

You could become a 
Millionaire and also win a year 
of FREE groceries. Each $25.00 
worth of groceries gets you one 

Lotto Quick Pick.
See Details in Store

Parade

M ilk
Parkay Whipped

M argarine
Shurfresh Medium

Eggs
Kraft Longhorn
Cheese

Medium  Yellow

Onions 
5 " -  / S l ^

FRESH PRODUCE
Broccoli  Bunch.8 9
Potatoes Lb , 3 9
Iceberg

Lettuce H.ad .49
Red Seedless ^  ^

Grapes .8 9

FROZEN FOOD
Parade
Ice Cream 1/2 gal.

sq. ctn.
Totino's Asst. Flavors & Sizes

1 .3 9
Pizza 1 .2 9

Farmers Choice Reg. Cut^,^ ^  ^  ^
French FrlesU,‘ 3 / $ 1

Prices Good 8/18 Thru 8/24
FOOD STAMPS WELCOME


