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Juvenile facility plans negotiated
Coke County Judge Royce 

Lee and C o u n t y  
Commissioners Tim Millican, 
James Tidwell, and Paul 
Burns, were in A u s t in  
Wednesday to make final 
nego tia tions with the 
Wackenhut Corporation for 
the facility for female juvenile 
offenders to be located in the 
county.

Steve Robinson, executive 
director of the Texas Youth 
Commission in Austin, an­
nounced Wednesday, May 
25, the selection of the Coke 
County site over 9 other bids. 
A press conference was held 
in the county courtroom on 
Thursday to confirm and 
discuss the selection. State 
Representative Rob Juneil, 
who deserves much of the 
credit for the selection, was 
on hand and named a number 
of other officials, including 
Sen. Bill Sims and U. S. Rep. 
Charlie Stenholm , who

worked diligently for Coke 
County.

Judge Lee also thanked a 
number of judges, juvenile 
officers, attorneys, mayors 
Martin Lee and Jackie Walker, 
the county commissioners, 
and citizens who had been 
beneficial in the effort.

According to Juneil, some­
times people are unaware of 
some who remained in the 
background in helping with a 
project such as his own staff. 
Gov. Ann Richards, Lt. Gov. 
Bullock, and Speaker Laney.

Texas Youth Commission 
representatives say they ex­
pect the Coke County facility 
to be a model and forerunner 
of those which will come later. 
Education, medical attention, 
substance abuse treatment, 
and counseling will be offered 
in the complex. Emphasis will 
be on rehabilitation rather 
than punishment.

In the initial announcement, 
Robinson emphasized the 
importance of this program 
providing services to meet the 
unique needs of female juve­
nile offenders as well as 
holding them accountable for 
their delinquent acts. He also 
stated that through this part­
nership with the private sec­
tor, the Texas Youth Commis­
sion will be able to expand its 
capacity in order to retain oth-. 
er offenders for longer peri­
ods in a secure placement.

Robinson said staff from the 
Texas Youth Commission and 
Wackenhut will enter into 
contract negotiations immedi­
ately with the facility to begin 
operations for 75-100 youth 
no later than Oct. 1, 1994.

The facility will originally em­
ploy 80 people, Lee said, but 
he added that this number 
does not include the con­
struction crew that will be 
needed to build the complex.

Upcoming

Br. Cemetery
Work Day

Coke County employees 
from Precinct 2 and 4 will be 
working at Fairview Cemetery 
in Bronte next Friday from 8 
a.m. until-.

All volunteers are welcome 
to participate in this endeavor 
to assist in cleaning up the 
cemetery. Refreshments will 
be available to all workers.

WCCCD
A general meeting of the 

West Coke C o u n t y  
Community Development will 
be held Monday evening, 
June 6, at 7 pm. The organi­
zation will convene in the 
Robert Lee State Bank board 
room. On the agenda will be 
the election of officers and 
board members, the calendar 
fundraiser, and the Labor Day 
Extravaganza.

Reunion Scheduled
The Harmon-Sparks fami­

lies' reunion is scheduled for 
Sunday, June 5. A covered 
dish luncheon at 12:30 will 
highlight the day at the 
Recreation Center at the 
county park in Robert Lee. 
Family friends are welcome to 
join them.

Coke Co. Baseball
Fundraiser

Coke County Baseball As­
sociation will host a fundraiser 
Saturday, June 1.8. Baseball 
games will start at 9:00 am with 
a barbecue lunch to follow at 
approximately 1:00 pm. More 
details will be announced next 
week.

Gospel Singing
"Ole-Fashioned G ospel 

Singing" will be held at the 
Fellowship Hall of Central 
Baptist Church in Bronte on 
Sunday, June 5 from 2-4 pm. 
Persons of all ages are en­
couraged to participate.

C om m odities
Food Commodities will be 

distributed on the second Fri­
day of the month, June 10, at 
the Bronte and Robert Lee 
Senior Citizens buildings, be­
ginning at 8 am and continu­
ing until 12 noon.

Sanco Homecoming
The annual, historic Sanco 

Homecoming will be held on 
the second Sunday in June, 
the 12th. Music and visiting 
will also take place on Satur­
day night, June 11. Camping 
places are available for those 
who wish to come and stay.

Blood Drive
The Bronte Nursing Home 

and United Blood Services 
are sponsoring a community 
blood drive on Thursday, 
June 9, from 4 to 7 p.m. at 
Bronte Nursing Home Activity 
Room.

Donations of blood are 
badly needed and the group 
is trying to help others with 
this project.

SWCD Fish
Stocking Program
In response to a number of 

requests since the rains, the 
Coke County Soil and Water 
Conservation District is spon­
soring a fish stocking pro­
gram.

Fish offered include chan­
nel cat, largemouth bass, 
bluegill, hybrid bluegill, min­
nows, and grass carp. Permits 
from TP&WD are required for 
purchase of grass carp.

Time is short. The only 
available delivery date is June 
24. Orders are being taken 
NOW through June 20. See 
the classified ads in this paper 
for fish sizes and prices.

For more information, call 
the SWCD office at 453-2623 
or come by 11 E. 6th. Street 
in Robert Lee.

On the last day of Story Time at the Coke 
County Library before summer vacation, those 
going into kindergarten in the fail "graduated". 
Story Time is heid at the iibrary once a week 
during schooi months for 3, 4, and 5 year oids 
not in kindergarten.

Story Hour
The Coke County Story 

Hour came to an exciting end 
of year with a party at the park 
on May 17. Everyone en­
joyed refreshments provided 
by various mothers. Approxi­
mately 40 little children got 
"tatoos", and received books 
and other party favors. The 
highlight of the day was when 
24 five-year-olds "graduated" 
to kindergarten.

It was a busy and exciting 
year for the Story Hour. Each 
month, the children enjoyed 
hearing stories, s in g in g  
songs, watching a monthly 
movie, and eating refresh­
ments. Refreshments were 
always a big favorite!

Other "favorites" were all 
the holiday parties and free 
pizza coupons provided by 
Shakey's Pizza each six 
weeks.

The children had a great 
year, and hopefully gained a 
greater love for reading!

RL Businesses 
B u rg la rized

Coke County Sheriff Mar­
shall Millican reported a bur­
glary over the weekend at C & 
W One-Stop on Commerce 
Street in Robert Lee. Access 
was gained to the building by 
breaking out the glass front 
door. The incident apparently 
took place in the early morn­
ing hours Memorial Day. The 
damage was reported by 
Standard-Times carrier Quin- 
cie Gregston. According to 
Millican, an undisclosed 
amount of cash was taken.

A burglary attempt was also 
made at Super H Foods on 
Commerce Street, roughly in 
the same time frame. Investi­
gation continues by the sher­

iff's office personnel into both 
incidents.

Several minor disturbance 
calls were fielded by the de­
partment but nothing else of a 
serious nature, such as 
dreaded fatalities w h ich  
sometimes occur over a long 
holiday weekend.

Bronte
S u m m erfest

Downtown Bronte wil be the 
place to be on Saturday, June 
4 for the fourth annual Sum­
mer Fest sponsored by the 
Bronte Chamber of Com­
merce.

A pet parade will be held 
downtown beginning at the 
Highway Garage to the Mini- 
Park at 10 a.m. Registration 
for entrants will be at 9:45 a.m. 
at the Highway Garage.

Food booths will be open 
downtown starting after the 
pet parade.

There will be an ice cream 
freeze-off at the Mini-Park at 3 
p.m. with prizes being award­
ed and the sale of the home­
made ice cream.

The West Texas Rodeo As­
sociation encourages every­
one to drop by the Jr. Rodeo 
on Saturday beginning at 11 
a.m. and will continue all day.

CC Bass Club
The Coke County Bass 

Club will have a m eeting 
Thursday, June 2, at at 7:30 at 
Ranchland Restaurant. For 
more information call 453- 
4603.

Bond Election -
A bond election will be held 

in Bronte at the City Hall on 
Tuesday, June 7 from 7 a.m. 
to 7 p.m. for the addition of a 
24 bed extension to Bronte 
Nursing Home.
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O b itu aries
Graves

Onis Ben "Sonnie" Graves, 
Jr. died at his Tennyson home 
Sunday, May 29, at 12:20 pm 
following a lengthy illness.

The funeral service was 
held at the Tennyson Baptist 
Church Tuesday, May 31, 
1994, at 2 pm with burial fol­
lowing in Mule Creek Ceme­
tery. The Rev. Brian Ross and 
the Rev. Marvin Clark officiat­
ed the services. Arrange­
ments were by Shaffer 
Funeral Home in Bronte.

Sonnie was born Feb. 8, 
1929, in San Angelo. He 
married Beatrice Louise Baker 
on Feb. 17, 1946. He was a 
member of the Tennyson 
Baptist Church and a longtime

Letter to the 
E d ito r

Dear Editor,
I wish to extend my sincere 

congratulations to Judge 
Royce Lee, the Coke County 
Commissioners, the Mayors of 
Bronte and Robert Lee and all 
others who worked so hard 
and gave of their time to make 
the Detention Center dream 
become reality. Thanks for a 
job well done!!!

Sincerely, 
Pam Shaffer

Antilley named to 
State com m ittee
Last week during the District 

7 Texas County Agriculture 
Agents Association annual 
meeting, Tommy Antilley, 
Coke County Agricultural Ex­
tension Agent, was selected 
to represent this area on the 
state Animal Industries Com­
mittee. This committee will 
oversee the educa tiona l 
needs of the cattle, sheep, 
goat and swine livestock In­
dustry in Texas. Antilley is al­
ready serving on the State 
Horse Committee which over­
sees educational activities for 
the horse industry of Texas.

employee of Gandy’s Dairy.
After his retirement in 1990, 

he had more time to pursue 
his hobbies of hunting, fish­
ing, woodworking a n d  
spending time with his family. 
He spent many happy days 
working on his place and 
fishing and hunting with his 
family. Sonnie will be truly 
missed by all who knew and 
loved him.

He was preceded in death 
by a son, James Onis; his 
mother and father; and one 
brother. He is survived by his 
wife, Louise, of Tennyson; 
two sons, and their wives, 
Roger and Janet Graves, and 
Jerry and Susan Graves, all of 
Bronte; seven grandchildren, 
LaTasha, Larry, Scott, Jake, 
Dalton, James, and Kendra 
Graves; and one sister, Marie 
Hasty of Robert Lee.

Pallbearers for the services 
were Charles Cowley, Ricky 
Cowley, Will Lenoir, Tom 
Francis, Gorman Walker and 
Chester Wilson.

The family requests memo­
rials be made to Hospice of 
San Angelo.

Letter to the 
E d ito r

Dear Editor,
The building of additional 

rooms at the Bronte Nursing 
Home is necessary for the 
continuation of the needed 
care for the sick and elderly 
citizens in our community. 
The nursing home has pro­
vided loving care to our loved 
ones for 24 years. The direc­
tors, administrator, and em­
ployees have worked togeth­
er In a way that has the Bronte 
Nursing Home rated one of 
the top small nursing homes 
in the state.

I support the East Coke 
County Hospital directors in 
their efforts and ask qualified 
voters to vote June 7 FOR the 
bond issue.

Billy Joe Luckett

Enjoy the area lakes, 
but remember to 

practice water safety!

BELL AUTO PARTS
Robert Lee 453-2911

Sanders conducts
rabies sem inar

Jeff Sanders with the De­
partment of Health in San An­
gelo presented a one-day 
seminar on rabies to Tommy 
Antilley, extension agent, and 
sheriff's department staff Mar­
shall Millican, Rick Styles, Jeff 
Barnes, and Wayne Mc- 
Cutchen.

The area, which has been 
plagued with rabies this year, 
is becoming more aware of 
the disease, but people are 
often not sure of what to do or 
whom to call. Numerous 
suspicious animals, especially 
fox, have been seen, but a 
good number of confirmed 
rabies cases have been noted 
in the county. Two county 
residents have already taken 
rabies shots.

Rabid fox have been killed 
in the Sanco area by Eddie 
Derrick and neighbors; some 
from Silver, Tennyson, and 
Valley View have also been 
reported.

Foremost of the warning 
symptoms of rabies is the loss 
of the fear of humans by wild 
animals; strange behavior of 
domestic animals - dogs, cats, 
or livestock; unsteadiness or 
appearing lame or injured due 
to loss of muscle control; 
skunks' loss of odor; or un­
usual death of animals. Most 
common carriers of rabies are 
fox, skunks, and bats. Birds 
(other than bats), possums, 
and squirrels, are not rabies 
carriers.

Those who deal with live­
stock are urged to be careful 
in handling sick animals. Pets 
should all have their shots.

Millican said according to 
their information, although the 
rabies is a deadly disease it is 
a fragile virus. It cannot live in 
a temperature lower than 
body temperature. A dead 
animal cannot transmit the 
disease, even if eaten by an­
other.

The Department of Health 
now recommends keeping a 
dog in isolation 90 days and 
giving it a rabies shot and 2 
boosters if it had not been 
vaccinated. If it had had a shot 
and is in contact with a rabies 
carrier, they recom m end 
isolation for 45 days and 1 
booster shot.

The sheriff's office is the 
county rabies control office. If 
you have an animal report or a 
question you may call 453- 
2717.

Letter to
the Editor

Dear Editor,
Home Care is a com ing 

thing for people who can 
partly take care of themselves, 
cheaper on the government 
as well as the taxpayers. As 
for the Nursing Home in 
Bronte, they said it had been 
paid out since 1986. I am 
aware they built on a room and 
a few other improvements but 
I can't imagine being in the red 
at the bank, and yet give rais­
es to the upper management. 
Also, why do they need an 
Assistant Administrator when 
it was operated so many years 
without one? I also can't 
imagine LVN's or RN's to work 
on the floor as was suggested 
at a director's meeting. The 
people need an account of 
the income and also expens­
es to know how to vote.

Sid Eubanks

Letter to the 
E d ito r

Dear Editor,
I am sure that you are all 

aware of the upcoming Bond 
Election for the East Coke 
County Hospital District. The 
Bonds are to finance an addi­
tional 24 beds to be added to 
the current 40 bed Nursing 
Home.

I feel that even though 
there will be a tax increase at 
this time, adding the addition­
al beds is necessary. A 40 
bed facility is no longer cost 
effective. The additional beds 
will provide increased rev­
enue.

Hopefully, this increase in 
beds will create only a short­
term tax increase. Whereas, 
at the current status, it ap­
pears taxés will be needed 
from now on to support the 40 
bed facility.

I encourage you to vote 
FOR passage of the Bond 
Election on Tuesday, June 
7th.

Martin Lee 
Mayor

Letter to 
, the Editor

Dear Editor,
There is to be a bond elec­

tion on June 7, which if 
passed will provide funds for 
expansion of the Bronte 
Nursing Home. The advan­
tage of having a health care 
facility for the elderly In this 
area far exceeds the dislike of 
additional taxes.

Your newspaper letters 
have reflected the positive 
aspects of this project in re­
cent weeks; however, it must 
be stated the Bronte Nursing 
Home receives all 911 tele­
phone calls which places an 
additional burden on their 
budget.

I hereby encourage every­
one to vote for the expansion 
of our nursing home and the 
continuing operation of the 
911 system.

Vote for, vote for, vote for...
Thanks for your 
consideration, 

James (Jim) Lammers

Public CPR Class
A community CPFt course is 

being offered by Abilene Re­
gional Medical Center June 4 
from 8:30 am until 5 pm in the 
Abilene Regional Resource 
Center, 6150 Regional Plaza. 
The course is open to the 
public.

The American Heart As­
sociation course B in basic life 
support is also called Adult 
and Pediatric Heartsaver. It 
includes adult, child and infant 
CPR and foreign body airway 
obstruction. A nominal fee will 
be charged for the one day 
course. For more information 
or to register, phone 691- 
2452.

WINK INSURANCE AGENCY
Home^Auto

L ife *H e a lth *C o m m e rc la l

715 Austin 453-4551

Bronte Chamber of Commerce 
PO Box 516 

Bronte, TX 76933
Congratulations Coke County for being selected as a 

Texas Youth Commission Facility Site. We at the Bronte 
Chamber of Commerce wish to extend our thanks to 

everyone involved in helping this facility come to Coke
County.

The Bronte Chamber of Commerce needs your help.
We will compile a list of properties in Coke County that 

are available for rent or sale. We will make this list 
available to investors, realtors, and interested parties. 
To do this we need to know several things. Please give 
us your name and address, the property's address, the 

property's legal description, and ail the property's 
improvements. We do not need to know any prices. 

Please return this information to The Bronte Chamber of 
Commerce, PO Box 516, Bronte, TX 76933 as soon as 

possible. By doing this you will help Coke County to grow 
with the addition of the Texas 

Youth Commission Facility.
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Meeks - Fox 
Engagement

Karen Lee Meeks and 
Robert Keith Fox will be mar­
ried July 2, 1994, at Sierra 
Vista Methodist Church in San 
Angelo. Texas.

Parents of the engaged are 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Meeks of 
San Angelo and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dean Fox of San Antonio.

Miss Meeks is a 1987 grad­
uate of San Angelo Central 
High School and received a 
bachelor's degree in Kinesi­
ology and Special Education 
in 1992 from Angelo State 
University.

Her fiance is a 1989 grad­
uate of San Antonio East 
Central High School and re­
ceived a bachelor's degree in 
Kinesiology and government 
in 1993 from Angelo State 
University.

Miss Meeks is a teacher/ 
coach at Bronte High School 
and Mr. Fox is working as a 
graduate assistant for the Ram 
Basketball team and will re­
ceive a graduate degree of 
Kinesiology in May 1995. 
They will live in Tennyson af­
ter the wedding.

Mosquito control 
d if f ic u l t

Due to the recent rains, the 
weeds and grasses have 
grown tremendously. This 
makes the problem of 
mosquito control even harder. 
There have also been reports 
of several rattlesnakes being 
killed in the City.

The Bronte City Council 
asks that all property owners 
keep their lots mowed to help 
mosquito control and improve 
the appearance of the City.

Residents are urged to use 
caution when working in tall 
grass and beware of skunks, 
possums, foxes, and stray 
cats and dogs.

Lake Spence Work
The City of Robert Lee is 

currently doing some repair 
work on Lake Spence pumps. 
Mountain Creek Lake only 
caught 3 feet in recent rains 
and the city must continue to 
use out of Spence which 
gained approximately four 
feet.

Thomason 
selected as
Drum Major

Stacy Thomason was se­
lected Drum Major of the 
Cougar Band at Lufkin Jr. 
High East. Tryouts were May 
7th. Stacy is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Thomason 
of Lufkin and the grand­
daughter of Mrs. Jerry 
Thomason of Robert Lee.

40+ Dance
The 40+ Dance will be held 

on the first Tuesday, June 7, 
at the Rec. Hall in Robert Lee. 
Dancing begins at 7:30 and 
tickets are available at the 
door.

Officers to 
be installed

Alpheus Hill of Wingate, 
Zone chairman for District 2A1 
Lions Clubs will be installing 
new officers for the Bronte 
Evening Lions Club for the 
ensuing year. The club will 
meet for this occasion on 
Tuesday, June 7, at 7 pm for 
dinner and a program at the 
Red Barn Barbecue in Bronte.

Karen Lee Meeks and Robert Keith Fox

Stenholm  
Introduces budget
Congressman C harles 

Stenholm recently introduced 
the Common Cents Budget 
Reform act of 1994 (CCBRA), 
bipartisan legislation to reform 
the budget process and con­
trol federal spending.

"Washington's failure to 
control spending and to 
wisely manage the taxpayer's 
money has become a threat to 
our nation's economic future," 
said Stenholm. "This legisla­
tion will make the budget pro­
cess more honest, more un­
derstandable, and will make 
an important contribution to a 
much-needed reform of the 
federal budget."

The Common Cents Bud­
get Reform Act would make 
the following four basic re­
forms: 1.) require that budget 
proposals compare their bud­
gets to the amount actually 
spent the prior year (the 
baseline), rather than against 
an inflated baseline; 2.) re­
quire congress to vote on 
rescissions proposed by the 
president, rather than ignor­
ing them as current law allows; 
3.) allow Members to desig­
nate that savings from cuts be

directed to deficit reduction; 
and 4.) stop u s i n g  
"emergency" spending bills, 
such as earthquake assis­
tance for example, to add 
spending for non-emergency 
measures.

"The folks in the coffee 
shops in the 17th District can't 
make heads or tails out of a 
federal budget process that 
talks about baselines and 
budget cuts, but results in 
deficit spending." said Sten­
holm. "It's time for us to take 
some of the confusion out of 
the budget process, and we 
can bê gin by saying what we 
mean and meaning what we 
say."

Stenholm anticipates votes 
on each of the four provisions 
of the CCBRA by the Fourth 
of July district work period.

Personal
Weekend visitors in the 

home of Raymond and Gertie 
Bloodworth were Carl and 
Laveta Bloodworth of Sun­
down, Amy Barnes o f 
Lazbuddie and Sheibi Garth 
of Lubbock. Joining the 
group for lunch on Sunday 
were Lonnie and Marla 
Bloodworth, Eli and Beau, Ar- 
lie McVey and Bruce McVey.
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SPECIALS GOOD 6/1 THRU 6/7

Boneless

Chuck Steak

Golden

V
C&H

Bananas
4  “ / . 9 9

4 Lbj 
bag

IGA Asst. Flavors

Ice Cream or 
Sherbet2 / $ 3| | | | | | | | | | |

Kleenex White

Bath
Tissue

4 roll
m

Hf-Dr i

B  Paper Towels
single /  r t

Ron

Coke, 7-Up, Mr. 
PIbb, Sunkist 

Orange, Fresca or 
Barqs Root Beer
6 pk.

12 02  ̂ cans1 . 3 9
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Bronte Elementary
A w ards

First Grade Awards 
Sixth Six Weeks

Perfect Attendance:
Blaine Dyess, Nicholas Flores, 
Jesse Herold , Calli Johnson, 
Ashley Wilcox, Ashleigh Kelly, 
Vanessa Lange, Cody Moore, 
Stephen Tomes, Salvador 
Sanchez.
All A's:
Blaine Dyess, Garrett 
Jackson, Calli Johnson, 
Ashleigh Kelly, Ashley 
McCutchen, Cody Moore, 
Victoria Ridgway, Nicholas 
Flores.
A/B Awards:
Christy Casares, Monica DeLa 
Garza, Jesse Herold, Romana 
Hoover, Vanessa Lange, 
Ashley Wilcox, Kinlee Hoyt, 
Salvador Sanchez. 
Responsibility Award:
Blaine Dyess, Calli Johnson. 
Citizenship Award:
Romana Hoover, Calli 
Johnson, Ashleigh Kelly, 
Ryan Martinez.
Maintained Straight A's All 
Year:
Blaine Dyess, Garrett 
Jackson, Calli Johnson,

Danielle Glenn

Glenn graduates
Danielle Denise Glenn is a 

recent graduate of Second 
Baptist High School in Hous­
ton. She is the daughter of 
David and Denise Glenn of 
Houston and the grand­
daughter of Clark and Mary 
Frances Glenn of Bronte.

Danielle graduated magna 
cum laude, having been on 
the honor roll all year. She is a 
member of the National Honor 
Society, the French National 
Honor Society, the Varsity 
basketball team, and played 
the lead (Anna) in the musical 
"The King and I."

She is listed in Who's Who 
in American High Schools and 
received the outstanding stu­
dent award in Computer Ac­
counting. Danielle was cho­
sen by her peers to receive 
the Servant Award given to 
the student who most exem­
plifies Christian character and 
service. During interim she 
worked with several Christian 
missions in the Hatcher Ser­
vice Program.

In addition to school activi­
ties Danielle sings with a con­
temporary Christian fo lk  
group, Caedmon's Call! She 
has received a scholarship 
from Houston Baptist Univer­
sity where she will enroll in the 
fall.

Ashley McCutchen, Victoria 
Ridgway.
Reading Award
'Most Reading Record Pages:
Ashley Wilcox.
Special Citizenship Award: 
Romana Hoover, Calli 
Johnson.
Reading Award Most Points: 
Garrett Jackson 
Perfect Attendance For the 
Year:
Garrett Jackson, Jesse 
Herold, Blaine Dyess.

Second Grade Awards
All A's
Kanah Coalson, Tyler Corley, 
Ashley Denton, Britney 
McCutchen, Casey McKee, 
Heidi Randazzo, Natalee 
Reed, Chase Williams.
Good Handwriting:
Tyler Corley, Ashley Denton, 
Kendra Graves, Joseph Israel, 
Jesse Rodriquez.
Math Wizard- Addition 
Josh Eubanks,-sums to 10, 
Tyler Corley, Casey McKee, 
Jesse Rodriquez, Chase 
Williams- all sums 10 or more. 
Math Wizard- Subtraction 
Kanah Coalson, Tyler 
Corley,Ashley Denton, Casey 
McKee, Natalee Reed, Chase 
Williams-minuends less than 
10 .
Citizenship Awards 
Tyson Baker, Kendra Graves, 
Sheena Head, Joseph Israel, 
Casey McKee.
Certificate of Excellence 
All A's All Year
Britney McCutchen, Heidi 
Randazzo, Chase Williams. 
Perfect Attendance last 6 
weeks
Kanah Coalson, Tyler Corley, 
Ashley Denton, Brittany 
Eldred, Garrett Fiveash, Roy 
Lee Flores, Brandon Hall, 
Sheena Head, Richard 
Hoover, Joseph Israel, Cody 
Lee, Casey McKee, Justin 
Moore, Heidi Randazzo, 
Natalee Reed, Jesse 
Rodriquez, Ashley Torres, 
Chase Williams.
■Perfect Attendance an Year 
Sheena Head, Joseph Israel, 
Heidi Randazzo, Chase 
Williams.

Teen party
All Bronte "teens" are 

invited to "Hit the Beach" 
Saturday, June 11, 6:30 till ? 
at the Bronte City Park.

Next year's High School 
students are invited to join in 
sand-n-surf fun, including 
limbo, firepit snacks, tropical 
drinks, beachin' volleyball, 
reggae music, and more!

See you at the Beach!

Bronte Awards
The following awards were 

presented during the Bronte 
Academic Awards Assembly, 
Thursday, May 19.

Academic Excellence 
Honor Roll

11th - Laura Thomas; 12th - 
Amy Bailey, Jim Beam, Wendy 
Huckabee, Justin Lampier, 
Jennifer Sparks, Edwin 
Thomas, and Casey Thorn; 
10th - Jill Johnson, Christy 
McKinney.

Highest Average from
each class for the year;
7th - Nicole Butts; 8th - An­

gela Shults; 9th - Felicia 
Beam; 10th - Jonathan De- 
Laughter; 11th - Laura 
Thomas; 12th - Amy Bailey. 

Student Council
Courtney Shaffer, Brent 

Taylor, Jay Parker, Amy Bai­
ley, Gina Clayton, and 
Nicholas Arrott.
Valedictorian - Amy Bailey

Salutatorian - Jim Beam 
8th Grade

Valedictorian - Glen Tampke 
Salutatorian - Angela Shults 

Tandy Scholarship 
Awards

Amy Bailey, and Wendy 
Huckabee

UIL Academic 
Participation

(Regional) Walter King - 
Mathematics, Ready Writing, 
Science; Casey Thorn - Math­
ematics, Number Sense; Ed­
win Thomas - Mathematics, 
Science, Number Sense; 
Johnathan DeLaughter - Sci­
ence; Wendy Huckabee - 
Number Sense.

Honor Roll Awards 
All A's for year

7th - Nicole Butts; 8th - Glen 
Tampke; 10th - Laura 
Thomas; 12th - Amy Bailey, 
Jim Beam, and Wendy Huck­
abee.

All A/B for year
7th - Bonnie DeLaughter, 

and Brandy Denton; 8th - An­
gelo Shults, and Courtney 
Beam; 9th - Felicia Beam, Kim 
Hall, Jodie Hilliard, Joy King, 
Kim McCorkle, Shelly Sims, 
and Keith Treadaway; 10th - 
Nicholas Arrott, Jonathan De- 
Laugther, Cody Holland, Ben 
Huckabee, Cory Robinson, 
and Shae Sanford; 11th - 
Micah Arrott, Jill Johnson, and 
Christy McKinney; 12th - Kim 
Blair, Justin Lampier, Jennifer 
McCorkle, Jay Parker, Cheryl 
Santos, Jennifer Sparks, Ed­
win Thomas, and Casey 
Thorn.

(cont'd. next page)

El Rancherò Restaurant
Mexican-American Food 

Open Tues.-Sat. 11 am - 2 pm & 5-9 pm 
Open Sunday 11 am - 2 pm 

224 W. Main Bronte 473-2140

SummerF est
Saturday, June 4th 

Pet Parade 
Food Booths 

Ice Cream Freeze-Off 
Buggy Rides

DOWNTOWN BRONTE 
Bronte Chamber 

473-3601

The Bronte girls T-Ball team members are: 
(front row, l-r) Calile Johnson, Ashley Mc­
Cutchen, Ashley Turner, Jessica Schneider, 
(back row, l-r) Christan Kelly, Ashleigh Kelly, 
Romana Hoover, Cheyenne Webb. Not Pic­
tured: Lynsee Mathews, Lillie McMullan, Sayia 
Carper, Lyndsey Butler, and Tana White.

Bronte Project
Graduation

The doors at Bronte High 
School were open to the 
Graduating Class of 1994 for 
the last time on Friday, May 27 
at 8:00 pm.

Although excitment was 
apparent there were a few 
tears shed as the graduates 
walked across the stage to re­
ceive their diplomas.

After the ceremony, the se­
niors were honored with a 
graduation dance featuring 
Redline f rom San Angelo. 
The group danced to Coun­
try-Western tunes with a little 
rock thrown in, and even the 
Twist was added to the music. 
Even though everyone 
seemed ready to drop after 
the dance, there was no time 
to be tired. It was time for 
"Project Graduation".

Nineteen seniors and a 
guest along with several par­
ents enjoyed the party.

After everyone had feasted 
on fresh-cooked hamburgers, 
pizza, dips, chips, and cake, 
the fun began. Games were 
played, some of them pre­
senting quite a humorous ar­
ray of body movements.

Drawings were held conti- 
nously all through the night. 
Prizes of all kinds were given 
away, along with gift certifi­
cates from a variety of differ­

ent restaurants. Each senior 
was presented with a cassette 
player, alarm clock, a nylon 
travel bag, and a $10 Cham­
ber Buck.

Grand prize drawings were 
held at the end of the 
evening. Following is a list of 
the winners and the prizes 
they received. Jess Percifull - 
Magnavox AM & FM radio 
cassette player; Jennifer 
Sparks - Cordless telephone 
and answering machine; Rudy 
Sanchez - Color TV; Wendy 
Huckabee - Microwave; Jay 
Parker - a quilt with hand de­
signs of all graduates; Jason 
Cooper - a Longhorn Flag.

A fun time was had by all 
who attended. The adults 
who participated can proudly 
say, "We survived "Project 
Graduation".

Br. Kindergarten 
G raduates

The follow ing Bronte 
students rece ived a 
kindergarten diploma on 
Thursday, May 26,1994.

Sarah Basquez, Lindy 
Butler, Riley Coalson, Shayla 
Carper, Christian Kelly, 
Charles T. Lloyd, Lynsy 
Matthews, Lillian McMullan, 
Curtis Moore, Garry Ozbirn, 
Bailey Saunders, Jaylon 
Saunders, Jessica Schneider, 
Cheyenne Webb, Jamie 
Vivian, Zachary White.

THE BRONTE EVENING LIONS CLUB 
SUPPORTS THE ADDITIONAL 24 

BED FACILITY ENLARGEMENT 
PROJECT OF THE BRONTE NURSING 

HOME!! PLEASE VOTE FOR THE 
BOND ELECTION ON JUNE 7TH!!I

f i j n  (U X

Pol. Adv. pd. for by Bronte Evening Lions Club 
c/o Leslie Rolls, PO Box 1011, Bronte, TX 76933



(Awards cont'd.)
UIL Scholar Award

Wendy Huckabee, Kim 
Blair, Jim Beam, Amy Bailey, 
Walter King, Jennifer Mc- 
Corkle, Jennifer Sparks, Ed­
win Thomas and Casey Thorn. 

Who's Who Awards 
Computer - Jennifer Sparks; 

Social Studies - Jim Beam; 
Theater Arts - Jennifer Mc- 
Corkle; English - Walter King; 
TAPE - Wendy Huckabee: 
Spanish - Micah Arrott; Jour­
nalism - Jay Parker; Math - 
Casey Thorn; Science - Walter 
King: Band - Amy Bailey; 
Boy's Athletic - Brent Taylor; 
Ag - Casey Thorn; Home 
Economics - Cheryl Santos; 
Girl's Athletics - Cheryl San­
tos: Yearbook - Wendy Huck­
abee: Art - Cheryl Santos; and 
Photography - Amy Bailey.

The following are awards 
given by the teachers in indi­
vidual courses:

Marifrances Mackev 
Algebra I - Courtney Beam; 

Angie Shults; Glen Tampke; 
Angela Willberg; Robb Harrell; 
Darrel Sharp; and Shane 
Boyd.

Algebra II - Felicia Beam; 
and David Wilson 

District Participants - 
who did not compete 

at regionals 
Cody Holland, Gary Walker, 

and Ben Huckabee.
Earth Science - Scott Graves, 
Courtney Beam, Glen Tampke 
Life Science - Bonnie De- 
Laughter, Nicole Butts, Cody 
Harris, and Jimy Soto.
Ready Writing - 7th - Nicole 
Butts, Mica Carper, and Jimmy 
Soto
Ready Writing - 8th - Miranda 
Scott, Scott Graves, and Glen 
Tampke
Maps. Graphs. Charts - 7th 
Shane Briley, and Jimmy Soto 
Maps. Graphs. Charts - 8th 
Michael Martinez, Miranda 
Scott, and Courtney Beam 
Oral Reading

Angie Shults, Angela Will­
berg, Amanda Scott, and Eli 
Speary 
One-Act Plav

Jennifer Sparks, Jennifer 
McCorkle, Christy McKinney, 
Wendy Huckabee, Casey 
Thorn, Terry Queen, Felicia 
Beam, Jamie Sullivan, Amy 
Bailey, Jay Parker, Joy King, 
Jacob Golson, Lynn Sonnen- 
berg - crew
Advanced Mathematics 

Edwin Thomas, Jim Beam, 
Jonathan D e L a u g h te r, 
Wendy Huckabee, Jill John­
son, and Casey Thorn 

English IV
Jim Beam, Amy Bailey, 

Wendy Huckabee, Justin 
Lampier, Edwin Thom as, 
Casey Thorn

Math Humanitarian 
Award - Casey Thorn 

Terah Collins 
Pre-Algebra - 7th Grade 
Outstanding Student - Nicole 
Butts '
"A" Honor Roll - Nicole Butts, 
Bonnie DeLaughter, and 
Brandy Denton

PARKER PLUMBING
Residential-Commercial 

All Types Plumbing Repair

, *New Construction 
♦Remodeling 
♦Fixtures
♦Sewer S e rv ic e v ^ y ^

Licensed Master Plumber

473-2131 Bronte

Algebra 1/2 - 8th Grade 
Outstanding Student 
Michael Martinez - 
"A" Honor Roll - Mfchael Mar­
tinez, Sommer Beck, and 
Scott Graves
Algebra 1/2 - Most improved 
student - Sommer Beck 
Math 87 - Outstanding Stu­
dent - Mica Carper and Cody 
Harris
Math 87 - Most Improved Stu­
dent - Chris Keller 
1994 WoodchoDoer's Award - 
Jason Emmons 
TAAS Math - Outstanding 
Student - Julie Martinez 

Elena Sanchez 
Spanish I

Nancy Sanchez, W endy 
Johnson, Melinda Mackey 
Spanish II

James Hambright, David 
Cason, Brent Taylor, J ill 
Johnson, Mandy Dunn, Laura 
Thomas, Micha Arrott, and 
Christy McKinney

Keith McCutchen 
Highest average in Ameri­

can History - Laura Thomas 
Kerry Lee

Health - Joy King, Shelly Sims 
American History - 8th - Glen 
Tempke
Texas History - Nicole Butts 

Kargn IVIegKs 
All Around 8th Reader - Ama- 
da Scott
All Around 7th Reader - 
Brandy Denton 
Most Improved Reader - 
Dustin Holland
Hardest Worker - Stacie McK­
ee

Rocky Rawls
World History - Jonathan De­
Laughter
Texas History - Cody Harris 

Mary McMullan 
Computer Literacy - G len 
Tampke, Angelo Shults, Mi­
randa Scott
Keyboarding - 9th - Felicia 
Beam, Joy King, Kale Beck, 
Kim Hall, Jodie Hilliard, and 
Shellie Sims
Microcomputer Applications - 
Amy Bailey, Jim Beam, 
Jonathan D e L a u g h te r , 
Wendy Huckabee, Jennifer 
Sparks, and Shane Boyd - 
Most improved
Keyboarding - 7th Grade - 
Nicole Butts, Brandi Denton 
National Honor Society 

National Scholarship Nomi- 
nees - Amy Bailey, and 
Wendy Huckabee 
Local Scholarship Recipients - 
Amy Bailey, Jim Beam, and 
Wendy Huckabee

Sara Loaan
Best All-Around English Stu-

dents - Rosalia Sanchez, Sta­
cie McKee, Dusty Arrott, 
Robb Harrell, Angie Shults, 
and Glen Tampke 
Outstanding Contribution - 
Joy King, and Felicia Beam 

Kristin Keel
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English III - Jamie Shipman - 
Most Improved Student 
English III - Gina Clayton - Best 
All-Around - Christy McKinney 
Journalism - Joni Barrett - Best 
All-Around
Drama - Terry Queen - Best All 
Around
English I - Joy King, and Feli­
cia Beam - Best All Around 

Julie Massey 
Life Management Skills - 
Angie Shults, Courtney 
Beam, and Glen Tampke 
Food Science and Nutrition - 
Courtney Stokes and 
Jonathan DeLaughter 
Apparel - Julia Gentry, and 
Gary Walker
Comprehensive Home Eco- 
nomics - Felicia Beam 

Jerita Tavlor
Life Science - Nicole Butts, 
and Bonnie DeLaughter 
Earth Science - Angie Shults, 
and Glen Tampke 
Efficiency award in science - 
Lynn Sonnenberg 
Certificates of Improvement in 
S-Cience
Physical S cience - Larry 
Graves; Biology I - Russel 
Vaughn; Life Science - Dawn 
Rhodes, and Shane Briley: 
and Earth Science - Trey Hol­
land
Certificates of Achievement in 
Science
Physical Science - Shaun 
Perry, Kim McCorkle; Biology I
- Ben Huckabee; Life Science
- Rosalia Sanchez and Brittany 
Barrett: and Earth Science - 
Sommer Beck
Highest Grade Aye.ra.ge. - 
Physical Science - Jodie 
Hilliard; Biology I - Cody Hol­
land: Life Science - Cody Har­
ris and Nicole Butts; and Earth 
Science - Glen Tamoke 

Perfect Attendance 
for the Year 

Julie Martinez, Casey Gibbs, 
Felicia Beam, Kale Beck, 
Shae Sanford, Russel 
Vaughn, Micah Arrott, Joni 
Barrett, Lindsey Burwick, 
Brent Taylor, Jim Beam, 
Wendy Huckabee, Jay Parker, 
and Edwin Thomas. 
Certificate of Excellence 
Physical Science - Robb Har­
rell; Biology I - Wendy John­
son; Life Science - Kim Perry

and Dustin Scott; and Earth 
Science - Miranda Scott.

George Tomes 
John Phillip Sousa - Casey 
Thorn
Director's Award - Amy Bailey 
Band Scholarship - Casey 
Thorn, Amy Bailey, and 
Wendy Huckabee

Jav Henderson 
Ag Course Recognition 

Laura Thomas, Casey 
Thorn, Shea Kelton, and 
Cody Holland

S  U l i  M . M : I

EBONI THVLORCertified Swim Instructor 
JUNE 13-17 & JUNE 20-24 

6 yrs. & up - 10-11 am 
5 yrs. & under - 11-12 am 

Bronte Pool 
$5 per lesson or

$25 per week 
Call 473-5551

Mrs. Gary Blair

Brown, Blair 
Exchange Vows

Kathy Brown and Gary Blair, 
both of Belton, exchanged 
wedding vows May 21 at two 
o'clock at the Miller Heights 
Baptist Church in Belton. The 
double ring ceremony was 
performed by ministers Billy 
Johnson and M. E. Stevens. 
Rodney Berthelot presented 
his daughter for marriage.

Mrs. Blair's parents are Mrs. 
Juanita Jericho of Enid, Okla­
homa: David Brown of Winnie; 
and Mr. and Mrs. Rodney 
Berthelot of Wichita Falls. Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Blair of Bronte 
are the parents of the groom.

Laura Jackson attended the

bride as maid of honor. 
Bridesmaids were Kelly Ray, 
sister of the bride, and Christy 
Stanley.

Serving as best man was 
Gary Lamm, while the groom's 
brothers, Michael and Andy 
Blair, were groomsmen for the 
ceremony.

Stephen Stringer, Toby 
Taff, and Chris Nagel were the 
ushers at the wedding.

A wedding reception fo r 
guests followed the service.'

The couple were students 
at the University of Mary 
Hardin-Baylor where the bride 
was a Social Worker major and 
the groom was a Nursing ma­
jor. They are at home in Tem­
ple following a wedding trip to 
Hot Springs, Arkansas.

GLENN-BIVINS INSURANCE 
Home, Auto, Life, and Health

123 W. Main Bronte 473-6791

THE TOWN & COUNTRY DIFFERENCE

An Employee Owned Company
COME EXPERIENCE THE TOWN AND 

COUNTRY DIFFERENCE
We are accepting applications for persons who 

are energetic, dependable, ambitious, have 
outgoing personalities and have personal 

integrity. Must have an ability to work in a 
fast-paced environment and know what it 

means to give outstanding customer service.
We offer an excellent variety of benefits 

including health insurance, paid sick leave, 
paid vacations, retirement plan, stock purchase 

plan and college reimbursement program. 
Career opportunities available for highly 

motivated/qualified persons.

Drug Testing Required 
Applications are available at

101 STATE STREET  
BRONTE, TEXAS

An Equal Opportunity Employer

THE TOWN & COUNTRY DIFFERENCE
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ROBERT LEE SCHOOL NEWS

RL Band
Saturday, May 14, 1994, 

the sixth grade band, under 
the direction of Mrs. Stazie 
Church, loaded the bus to go 
to the San Angelo Band and 
Orchestra Contest. The band 
received a "1" rating in 
Concert and a "1" rating in 
Sightreading and got to bring 
home a Sweepstakes trophy 
for their effort! Every member 
of the band also played a solo 
and/or an ensemble. Those 
who received a "1" got a 
medal and those w h o  
received a "11" got a ribbon.

"1" ratings: Ensemble - 
Jennifer Woods, Gina Torres, 
and Jaime Luna; Macy Hill and 
Jamie Luna; Gina Torres and 
Jennifer Woods; C o k e  
Hendry and Matthew Pitcock; 
Melanie Johnson and Aman­
da Barrera; Melanie Johnson 
and Ashley Townsend; Nicky 
Service and Nick Pinson; 
Jeremy Eaton and Andrew 
McCabe; Shyla Cole and Macy 
Hill.

Solos - Ashley Townsend, 
Melanie Johnson, Jeremy 
Eaton, B. J. Bessent, Nick 
Pinson, Jamie Luna, Brandon 
Van Huss, Macy H ill ,  
Stephanie Cornejo, Cecilia 
Ortega, Joel Gallegos, Daniel 
Cates, Shane Hendrix and 
Cassandra Munoz.

"11" rating: Nicky Service.
On Friday, April 29, 1994, 

ten band musicians travelled 
to Fredericksburg to try out for 
Junior High All-District Band. 
Of these ten musicians, three 
ranked high enough to get to 
play in the All-Region Concert 
Band. These three were: 
Melissa Smith, Flor Barrera, 
and Sondra VanDeventer. 
They traveled to Sonora the 
next day where they had a 
clinic for five hours and then 
played a c o n c e r t .  
Congratulations to these girls 
and the hard work they put in 
to receive this honor.

Monday evening. May 16, 
1994, the music department 
at Robert Lee presented their 
Spring Band Concert. The 
fourth grade recorders played 
THE MUSICAL BOX, CAN­
TILENA, and LEGEND with 
piano accompaniment, and 
E'S E JAMMIN' with tape ac­
companiment. The recorder 
group played well together 
and impressed the audience. 
The fifth grade band was next. 
They played their versions of 
MICKEY MOUSE MARCH, 
POWER ROCK, TH R EE 
ROCKIN' RODENTS, AND 
MUSIC! MUSIC! MUSIC! This

group has improved greatly 
over the year. Next were the 
sixth graders. They wowed 
the audience with INFINITY, 
UNDER THE SEA, BEGIN­
NER'S CHA-CHA, and AT­
LANTIS. The Steer Band was 
the last band to perform. 
They played STONEHENGE 
OVERTURE, FLUTES ON 
THE RUN, GLEN CANYON 
OVERTURE and SAXO­
PHONES ON THE RUN. 
Recognition was given to the 
1993-94 Drum Majors, Band 
Council, Loading Crew, and 
Band Sweetheart and Beau. 
The following students - Vot­
ed awards were also present­
ed: Outstanding Bandsman - 
Girl - Patricia Minjarez, Boy - 
Starsky Oleksiuk; and the 
John Phillip Sousa Award 
went to Patricia Minjarez. The 
evening concluded with a 
combined sixth grade/Steer 
band playing on oldie, but 
goodie, BEEP, BEEP. The 
bands are all under the direc­
tion of Mrs. Stazie Church.

P ro je c t
Graduation 1994
Friday night was graduation 

night and time for Project 
Graduation. Project Gradua­
tion originated several years 
ago. It is intended to be a 
drug and alcohol free party to 
honor graduating seniors. 
Seventeen of the nineteen 
RLHS graduates participated. 
High school students and up 
danced from 10-12. After 
twelve, the seniors and their 
guests danced and had sup­
per. DJ's Kyle Long and Billy 
Hawkins worked overtime and 
played music until 1:30. The 
rest of the night was spent 
playing games, bidding for 
prizes supplied by our spon­
sors, popping balloons for 
door prizes, and eating 
breakfast. Parents and se­
niors enjoyed the night. All 
persons involved greatly ap­
preciated our sponsors. The 
night would not have been 
possible without their back­
ing. Senior parents appreci­
ated the large number of se­
niors who attended Project 
Graduation.

Former RL 
students graduate

The following students 
graduated from Texas Tech 
University during the Spring 
1994 Semester: Roy Brent 
Gibbs, Interdisciplinary Agri­
culture, Bachelor of Science; 
and Jason Matthew Wink, 
Agricultural E co nom ics , 
Bachelor of Science.

IMMENG LIB S SOM i
Robert Lee Pool

June 6 - June 10
10:00 - 10:45 11:00 - 11:45

$25 per week
Instructors: Harley Wagner, 

Eric & Aaron Hood
CALL 453-2065 - 

453-2036 OR 453-2329

Steers gain 
Sportsm anship  

Award
by Joan Davis

An ardent sports fan myself,
I feel it would be extremely 
difficult to continue to follow 
and support teams exhibiting 
poor sportsmanship like some 
we encountered this year in 
both football and basketball.

I have been to the Athletic 
Banquet for the last six years 
and have yet to attend when 
coaches and administrators 
have not mentioned how 
proud they were to take 
"these young ladies and gen­
tlemen" anywhere. Th is 
means a lot to me and I've of­
ten said that young people 
respond to how much is ex­
pected of them. -

The Southwest Basketball 
Officials Association recently 
awarded four Texas high 
school teams with its Horlen- 
Neeley S p o rts m a n s h ip  
Award. Our local Robert Lee 
Steers were one of them.

Class 5A Amarillo High 
School and Class 3A Canyon 
High School won the girls' 
award while the boys' honor 
went to 4A Plainview High 
School and 1A Robert Lee.

The association gives the 
award annually to the schools 
whose players, coaches, stu­
dents, and fans display the 
most sportsmanship. This 
year's winners were selected 
from a field of 2,300.

The Steers were the District 
22-1A runner-up during the 
1993-94 season and ad­
vanced to the Region IM A  
championship game before 
falling 77-75 to eventual state 
champion Lipan. The Steers 
finished the season with a 24- 
5 record.

The Accelerated Reading winners for the 
month of May from Robert Lee Elementary 
display their awards.

RL Accelerated 
Reading Program
Accelerated Reading Win­

ners for May are: 1st grade - 
Burns - Julie Riley and Collin 
Fleming: 2nd grade - 
Goodman - Chris Eubanks, 
and Shannon House; 2nd 
Grade - Horn - Jessica Fluh- 
mann and Amber Perez; 3rd 
Grade - Gibbs - Shelby Roe, 
Kim Keating: 3rd Grade - 
McCown - Ashlee Millican; 
5th Grade - Wilson - Cayla 
Jeffrey and Amber Freeman; 
5th Grade - Goodman - 
Chase Rainwater, and Lane 
Fenton: 6th Grade - 
Mauldin - Coke Hendry and 
Matthew Pitcock.

ASU Dean's List
Area students attending 

Angelo State University in 
San Angelo, are listed on the 
Dean's List for the Spring 
semester at the University.

Those listed include Eli 
Arellano, a Mathematics major; 
Cailie Lee Bewick, a Commu­
nication major; James Warren 
Brasher, a Biology major; Jim 
Sterling Herring, a Psycholo­
gy major; Janet Lee Pente­
cost, an English major; Ce­
leste Service, an Elementary 
Education major; Clint D. 
Smith, a Government major; 
Kendra Beth Underwood, a

Kinesiology major; James D. 
Wilson, a Public Administra­
tion major; and Lori L. Wink, a 
Psychology major, all from 
Robert Lee.

To be eligible for the Dean's 
List, a student must be en­
rolled as a full time student 
and have at least a 3.25 grade 
point average.

RL Honor Roll
Robert Lee Elementary 

Honor for the 6th Six Weeks 
has been posted by Principal 
Lane Jackson. Those honor 
students are:

3rd - Gibbs
Jeffrey Carper, W hitney 

Fleming, Kimberly Keating, 
Stewart Millican, and Shelby 
Roe

3rd - McCown
Ashlee Millican, A m ber 

Robinson, Travis Pitcock, 
Cooper Riley

4th - Davis
Jodee Helwig, and Bobbie 

Sparks
4th - Walker

Jamie Chesshir, and Shan- 
na Hendrix

5th - Wilson
Mary Arellano, A m b e r 

Freeman, Cayla Jeffrey, Erin 
Millican, and Dixie Simpson 

6th - Mauldin
B. J. Bessent, Daniel Cates, 

and Dan McCown

PROJECT GRADUATION '94
was a big success . A big portion of that success was due 

to the generosity of the following businesses and 
individuals. Thanks!

Daryl Copeland 
Adams Land & Realty 
Hayrick Lodge 
'64 Study Club 
Key Feed
Ernest Clendennen Co.
O.E.S. Chapter 187 
WTU
Robert & Mona Mathers 
Nancy & Kenneth Rasco 
Super H
United Methodist Women 
Shaffer Funeral Home 
PCR Feed Yard 
Davis Grocery 
Sid & Kathy McCown 
Robert Lee State Bank

BRONTE
S&S Printing
First National Bank of Bronte

Gossett, Harrison, Reese, Wilson, 
Woodward & Millican 
Nathan's Jewelers
Herrington, Inc. (Holiday Cleaners) 
Zenmer's Steak House 
Senator & Mrs. Bill Sims

ROBERT LEE
Cristie & Mike Bagwell
Jewell Wallace
Silver Baptist Church
Milbum Wink
Coke County Abstract
The Best Connection
The Observer/Enterprise
Doug & Debbie Wilkes
R.L. & Evelyn Flanagan
Especially for You
Inez Hamm
J&B Lumber
Mountain Creek Lodge
First United Methodist Church
Pecan Baptist Church
Dee McCleskey
Skinner's Grocery & Gas

SAN ANGELO
Hobo Depot 
Salon Salon 
Jim Bass Ford 
All-American Chevrolet 
Mr. Boots
Keaton Kolor__________

Rock Oil Company 
The Flower Sak 
James Herford 
Sunshine Gardens 
& Big Boys Toys 
Coke County Officials 
Robert Lee PTA 
C&W
Ace Hardware
Kaye & Gaylon Pitcock
Alpha Beta Alpha
Nolan & Mary Jo Pentecost
Bill & Eula Faye Blair
Kevin Roe
Greg Fleming
Jimmy Randolph

ABILENE
West Texas Equipment 
Sam's Club

Little Mexico 
Sunset Mall 
H .E.B. Co.
Rep. Robert A. Junell 
Bart Mann Originals 
Texas Dept, of Transportation



Robert Lee 
Academ ic  
Assem bly

May 23, 1994
Academic Awards 

High School
English 
Elaine Gibbs 
Science 
Heather Millican 
Math
Elaine Gibbs 
Social Studies 
Rachel Pentecost 
Spanish
Rachel Pentecost 
Computers 
Wendy McPeek 
Business 
Heather Nichols 
HomeEc 
Heather Millican 
Vo- Ag-
James Tennison 
Athletics
Kim Carver, Joe Blair, and
John Williams
Jr. High
English
Jessica Key
Science. Life
Whitney Montgomery
Mam
Chad Helwig 
Social Studies 
Erika Galvan 
Computer Lit.
Chris Woods 
Typing
Mariusz Skibicki

Honor Roil for 
each six weeks 

Elaine Gibbs, W e n d y  
McPeek, Shanon Parks, 
Rachel Pentecost, John  
Williams, Aaron Hood, David 
Millican, Heather Millican, Ja- 
clyn Waldrop, Chad Helwig, 
and Mariusz Skibicki. 
Valedictorian 
Elaine Gibbs 
Salutatorian 
Rachel Pentecost 
UIL Scholar Award 

Elaine Gibbs, Rachel Pen­
tecost, Wendy McPeek, Dean 
Burns, John Williams, Kim 
Carver, Joe Blair

Tandy Technology 
Scholar 

Elaine Gibbs
Presidential Academic 

Fitness Award
Elaine Gibbs, Rachel Pen­

tecost, Saul Arellano, Wendy 
McPeek, Shanon Parks, Dean 
Burns, John Williams, Kim 
Carver
PAR Good Citizen Award
John Williams

64 Study Club
Scholarship 

Elaine Gibbs 
All American Award
Elaine Gibbs

Senior Congressional 
Certificates

Saul Arellano, Sean Barrett, 
Joe Blair, Dean Burns, Kim 
Carver, Elaine Gibbs, Danielle 
Glenn, Michael Hodges, 
Michael Johnston, Kathy 
Kapchinski, Wendy McPeek, 
Scot Millican, Sheila Minjarez, 
Shanon Parks, Rachel 
Pentecost, Judd Pitcock, 
Christy Thompson, John 
Williams, and Michael Woolley 
Student Council 
President 
Elaine Gibbs 
Vice President 
Lee McCown 
Secretary
Heather Millican 
Treasurer 
Joe Blair 
Reporter 
Rachel Pentecost
Class Representatives

12th - Shanon Parks, John 
Williams
11th - Laura Chesshir, Jeremy 
Fluhmann
10th - Jaclyn Waldrop, Aaron 
Hood
9th - Kannan Millican, Starsky 
Oleksiuk
8th - Tracy Millican, Matthew 
Millican

Cheerleaders
Elaine Gibbs, Kim Carver, 

Shanon Parks, Heather Milli­
can, Kannan Millican 

Annual Staff 
Wendy McPeek, Jo h n  

Williams, Jeremy Fluhmann, 
Lee McCown, Aaron Hood, 
Jaclyn Waldrop, Chad Good­
man, Rachel Shook

Robert Lee Merit 
Award - UIL Academics 

Cvnthia Abalos - 1st. Dist. 
Feature Writing 
Tiffany Brunina - ••̂ th. Dist. 
Poetry: 5th. Literary Criticism 
Jeremy Burns - 3rd. Dist. 
News Writing
Cameron Cook - 2nd. Dist. 
Spelling: 3rd. Dist. Headline 
Writing
Jeremy Fluhmann - 3rd. Dist. 
Calculator App: Dist. Top 
Scorer in Math
Flaine Gibbs - 4th. Dist. News 
Writing: 3rd. Editorial Writing 
Chad Goodman - 1st. Dist. 
Comp. Science Team 
Daniel Haves - 6th. Dist. Cur­
rent Events
Christy Hendry - 6th. Dist. 
Feature Writing 
Meagan Hill - 1st. Dist. Prose 
Jason Key - 2nd. Dist. Num­
ber Sense: 1st. Dist. Science 
(chemistry)
Michael Lamar - 1st. Dist. Cur­
rent Events: 3rd. Dist. Literary 
Criticism
Wendy McPeek-1st. Dist. 
Keyboarding
Heather Millican - 1st. Dist. 
Editorial Writing: 3rd. Dist. 
Spelling 
Kannan Millican - 4th. Dist.

Texas Association of Bas-The Observer/Enterprise 
ketball Coaches: All Regional 
Team - Joe Blair and Lee Mc­
Cown: All State Basketball 
Award/Texas Assoc, of BB 
Coaches - Lee McCown.

Regional Qualifiers 
in Track 

Jeremy Fluhmann 
Pole Vault - 1st. Dist.
Wayne Haves 
1600m - 2nd. Dist.
Rachel Pentecost 
Long Jump - 2nd Dist: 800 
Relay - 2nd. Dist.
Elaine Gibbs
High Jump - 2nd. Dist.: 800 
Relay - 2nd. Dist.
Kim Carver
300 Hurdles - 2nd. Dist.: 800 
Relay - 2nd. Dist.
Laine Gregston 
800 relay - 2nd. Dist.
Shalon Waldrop 
Shot Put - 2nd. Dist.
Tennis
Eric Hood - 1st. Dist.
Aaron Hood -1 st. Dist.
Cross Country 
2nd. - District

Eric Hood: Daniel Hayes,
David Sevier, Eric Torres,
Koby Howell, and Saul Arel­
lano

Setting new school 
records in track

John Williams - Shot - 55' 11 
1/4"
Dean Burns - Discus - 165' 2 
1/ 2 "

Charles Haves. Adam Morgan.
Bart Goodman, and Scot 
Millican - 400 relay (tied school 
record of 43.6)

State Qualifiers 
in Athletics

Track
Scot Millican, Joe Blair,
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Third grade cast members of A Bat for Babe 
gather outside Robert Lee Elementary School.

In recent years LCD has

Prose
Patricia Miniarez - 4th. Dist. 
Spelling
Jennifer Parks - 3rd. Dist. In­
formative Speaking 
Rachel Pentecost - 5th. Dist. 
Ready Writing
Judd Pitcock - 1st. Dist. Com­
puter Science Team 
Korv Pitcock - 1st. Dist. Per­
suasive Speaking 
David Sevier - 6th. Dist. Cal­
culator Application 
Jacivn Waldrop - 1st. Dist. 
Mathematics: 4th. Dist. Num­
ber Sense: 1st. Dist. Calcula­
tor Application
Shalon Waldrop - 5th. Dist. In­
formative Speaking 
Anthony Wink - 3rd. Dist. Per­
suasive Speaking: 6th. Dist. 
Mathematics
Michael Woollev - 1st. Dist. 
Computer Science Team 
Jason Wvatt - 4th Dist. Ready 
Writing

Athletics
Basketball Awards

Dean Burns, John Williams, 
Bart Goodman, Jerrid Vincent, 
Lee McCown, Adam Morgan, 
and Charles Hayes.
QqI

Wendy McPeek, Kim Carv­
er, Krystal Carver, Shanon 
Parks, Danielle Glenn, John 
Williams, Dean Burns, Joe 
Blair, Jerrid Vincent, and Ja­
son Tavarez
RL 3rd Grade Play
On Thursday, May 26, the 

third grade classes presented 
A Bat for Babe to students 
and parents in the auditorium. 
Starring in the play were: 
Whitney Fleming, Stewart Mil­
lican, Jeffrey Carper, Nicole 
Sanchez, Cooper Riley, Travis 
Pitcock, Amie Kendall, Ashlee 
Millican, Amber Brosh, Amber 
Robinson, Justin Sexton, 
Kimberly Keating, Shelby 
Roe, Jake Whiteker, Jamie 
Hendrix, Chris C law son , 
Phillip Rangel, Juan Olguin, 
Adam Caston, Matthew 
Boone, Moses Flores, and 
Cristina Saucedo. These 
students did a great job 
learning their parts and ac­
tions. Mrs. Judy Gibbs and 
Mrs. Kathy McCown directed 
the play.

RL student 
graduates  
from LCU

Wes Horn of Robert Lee 
was one of 141 students who 
participated in graduation ex­
ercises at Lubbock Christian 
University this spring. These 
ceremonies mark the 35th 
graduating class of the Uni­
versity.

Horn graduated with a 
Bachelor of Arts in Liberal Arts 
and is the son of Jerry and 
Mimzi Horn of Robert Lee.

Lubbock Christian Universi­
ty (LCU) is a Liberal Arts insti­
tution of higher learning dedi­
cated to providing a quality 
education in a Christian envi­
ronment. LCU was among 
only six Texas schools to be 
named in the John Templeton 
Foundation Honor Roll of 
Character Building Universi­
ties in 1992. LCU offers 35 
bachelor's degree programs 
and two master's degrees.

enjoyed national recognition. 
The sports program has an­
nounced seven national team 
championships, more than a 
dozen individual champions, 
and more than 80 All-America 
performances. In addition to 
athletics, the Students in Free 
Enterprise team have won the 
International Championship 
four times.

While at Lubbock Christian 
University, Horn was a mem­
ber of Alpha Chi Delta's men's 
social club, M eistersinger 
Chorus and King's Heirs Dra­
ma Ministry.

Personal
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Carver 

and children, Carolyn and 
Daniel Lee of Coahoma were 
guests of his brother, John 
Carver, and family in Robert 
Lee last Friday. The family 
group attended commence­
ment exercises for local se­
niors' graduation which in­
cluded Kim Carver.

CLOUD SEEDING EVENT INFORMATION 
AS PERFORMED BY THE COLORADO 

RIVER MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT 
OVER COKE COUNTY, TEXAS 

FOR THE SEVEN DAY PERIOD ENDING 
MAY 27, 1994

On May 25,1994, clouds were seeded from 4:47 pm to 
4:52 pm, 15 miles northwest of Robert Lee. Clouds moved 

northeast at 30 miles per hour.

O.H. Ivie
General Manager
Colorado River Municipal Water District 
PO Box 869, Big Spring, Texas 79721

PERCE
o f M I N D

One of our finest 
products.

No one has euer lost a 
dime in a federally 
insured bank account!

Each depositor insured to $100,000

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION

t = i
EQUAL HOUSING
LENDER

Robert Lee 
State Bank

Member F D IC
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Want to Qo to Palo Duro 
Canyon?

The Concho Valley RSVP, 
Retired Senior Volunteer 
Program, is sponsoring a trip 
to see "Texas". It is a musical 
drama performed under the 
stars in a beautiful setting in 
Palo Duro Canyon. A barbe­
cue dinner, a tour through the 
Palo Duro State Park, a stop at 
the Panhandle-Plains Muse­
um, "Texas", a cowboy morn­
ing breakfast at the Figure 3 
Ranch are the highlights of 
the trip. Trip includes: Roun- 
trip motorcoach transportation 
from San Angelo, motel ac­
commodations at La Quinta in 
Amarillo, baggage handling, 
admission to all included at­
tractions, accident insurance, 
gratuity for bus driver, and 2 
meals, barbecue dinner and 
cowboy breakfast. Call (915) 
949-8056 to make your 
reservations today. The trip is 
scheduled for August 11-12,

M y ric k -H e s te r
Reunion

The Myrick-Hester Cousins 
Reunion was held in the Lions 
Club Building in Early May 7. 
Twenty-two relatives enjoyed 
a day of visiting, taking annual 
photos, going over picture al­
bums, and enjoying a cov­
ered-dish luncheon.

Attending the gathering 
together were Marie Hester, 
Sondra Hester, Joan Davis, all 
of Robert Lee, and Mozelle 
Smith of Bronte. Other 
cousins at the annual reunion 
were Truett and Lorea Myrick 
of Brenham; Billie Wallace of 
Haltom City: Mona Casey of 
Abilene: Roy Max and Char­
lene Hester, also of Abilene: 
Vada Bagley and Maurine 
Myrick Foster, both of Brown- 
wood: Willard and Ann Myrick 
of Bulverde: Betty and Hays 
Prince of Jayton: Lyndon 
Yarbrough of Mesquite: Albert 
and Billie Hughes of Ft. 
Worth: Jesse and Hazel Big- 
bee of Baird: and Bill Myrick of 
Blanket.

Late in the afternoon, a 
group of relatives visited the 
country cemetery of Pleasant 
Valley 18 miles north of 
Brownwood where a large 
number of Myricks are buried. 
Much of the family was raised 
in the Brownwood area.

McGinley
com pletes

program
Cathy McGinley of Robert 

Lee State Bank has success­
fully completed the Year II 
program at the 1994 School 
of Applied Banking at Texas 
Tech University. The School 
of Banking is a week long 
program conducted over two 
years. The students attend 
their first year in May and re­
turn the following May to 
complete the program. The 
School is an intense program 
of case studies and bank 
management simulation de­
signed for professionals in the 
banking community.

1994. Call the Bronte Senior 
Center to find out about cost, 
etc.
Nursing Home Bond Election 

Show your support by 
casting a vote, Tuesday, June 
7th at City Hall. If you are un­
able to make arrangements for 
transportation call the Bronte 
Senior Center and we will find 
you a ride.
Commodities & Blood Pres- 
sure

It's that time again, Friday, 
June 10th at 8:00 a.m. until 
12:00 noon. Ballinger Home 
Health will be here from 8 to 
9:00 a.m. to take your blood 
pressure at no cost to you. 
Need Your Hearing Aid 
Cleaned?

Debbie Hamilton, Audiolo­
gist from Angelo Clinic will be 
at the Bronte Center at 12:30 
p.m., Friday, June 10th. 
There is no charge for this 
service. She will need to 
leave by 2:15 so come early. 
We are hoping that this will be 
a monthly service that we can 
provide for you. Debbie is in 
Robert Lee in the morning on 
that same day.
Coming Up

Tuesday, June 21st our 
Annual Hamburger Cookout. 
Entertainment will be provid­
ed. 6:00 p.m. to 9:00 p.m. 
Meals for the Week 
Monday. June 6 
Baked Pork Chop, Gravy, 
Mashed Potatoes, Seasoned 
Carrots, Hot Roll, Peach 
Cobbler.
Wednesday. June 8
Salisbury Steak, Pork N 
Beans, Mustard Greens, 
Cornbread, Peaches.
Friday. June 10 
Bar-B-Q Pork, Potato Tots, 
Mixed Vegetables, Bun, 
Oatmeal Cookies.

Bronte Sorosis 
Club

The Bronte Sorosis Study 
Club met last Tuesday night. 
May 17, in the home of Mrs. 
Pat Oglesby for the last meet­
ing of the group for the 1993- 
94 season.

Diane Luckett, president, 
presided for the business 
meeting, when discussions 
were held about the club's in­
volvement in local community 
projects for the upcoming 
year.

Reports were heard from 
Secretary Mildred Thomason, 
Treasurer Mary Glenn and 
committee chairpersons.

Mrs. Luckett was installing 
officers for the Installation of 
the new officers for the en­
suing club year scheduled to 
convene in September 1994.

New officers for the new 
year include: President, Mary 
Frances Glenn: 1st Vice- 
P re s id e n t ,  M i l d r e d  
Thomason: 2nd V ic e -  
President, Pat Oglesby: 3rd 
Vice-President, Pat . Lee: 
Secretary, Diane Luckett: 
Treasurer, Mary Glenn: Re­
porter, Margaret Martin: Par­
liamentarian, Jean Fancher: 
Historian, Peggy Hembree, 
and committee members were 
named. After the impressive 
installation cerem ony re­
freshments of angel food 
cake, whipped creme and 
strawberries and coffee and 
fruit punch were served to the 
above officers and Betty Lee 
and guest Hazel Percifull.

Personal
Guests in the home of 

Raynelle and Charlie Askins of 
Sulphur Springs included 
Raymond and Gertie Blood- 
worth of Silver, Foy and Es­
telle Askins of Robert Lee, 
and Debbie and Danny Carp­
er, Jeffrey and Casey of 
Robeh Lee. On May 14th, 
the group attended the col­
lege graduation of Miki Askins 
from East Texas State Univer­
sity in Commerce, Texas. Miki 
is the granddaughter of the 
Bloodworths and the Askins.

A great time was had by all.

Sh a n n o n

HEALTH NOTES
Alcohol Traffic Deaths Down

The good news is that national health objectives for the year 
2000 regarding alcohol-related traffic deaths have already been sur­
passed. The Centers for Disease Control and Prevention and the 
National Highway Safety Administration report that between 1982 
and 1992 alcohol-related traffic deaths decreased thirty percent, 
most of that coming between 1990 and 1992.

Despite the rapid success of the efforts to reduce drunk driv­
ing. the federal statistics still suggest that, unless more progress 
is made, about forty percent of us will be involved in an alcohol- 
related crash during our lifetime. The federal government has set 
as one of its goals for the next four years, reducing the proportion 
of alcohol-related traffic deaths from the current forty-five percent 
to forty-three percent.

Another goal is to increase seat belt use to seventy-five per­
cent from the current sixty-two percent. If successful, the CDC 
says these goals could save nearly three thousand more lives each 
year plus a savings of nearly a billion dollars in heath-care costs.

-1992, Lyle Dean, Inc.
Shannon Health Notes is a public service of

J L  Shannon M edical Center
12(! East Harris • San .\nt;elo. Te.\a:i • oSS-oN l. Ext.

Jeffie Roberts conducted a historical tour of 
the Robert Lee area for the Robert Lee Ele­
mentary 5th grade girls on May 17, 1994. 
They are standing with property owners 
(center) Carl and Bennie Helen (Turney) Rush. 
The barn in the background was built around 
1860. It was the headquarters for the fencing 
war at the Harris Ranch headquarters.

P roc lam ation  
Appreciation week for 

the Robert Lee High 
School Girls and Boys 
Golf and Track Team 
To the Citizens of Robert 

Lee, Texas:
WHEREAS, the girls golf 

team has won the state cham­
pionship in Class 1A competi­
tion, and

WHEREAS, the boys track 
team placed one inidividual in 
first place in state class 1A 
competition, and 

WHEREAS, several stu­
dents qualified for class 1A 
state competition in golf and 
track events, and 

WHEREAS, these individu­
als have by their individual 
high character and personality 
represented their city and 
school so well,

NOW, THEREFORE, I 
Jackie Walker, in my capacity 
as mayor for the City or Robert 
Lee, Texas, do hereby pro­
claim the week of May 30, 
1994 - June 3, 1994 as Ap­
preciation Week in the City of 
Robert Lee for the State 
qualifying golf and tra ck  
teams'

GIRLS GOLF: W e n d y  
McPeek, Danielle Glenn, Kim

Carver, Shanon Parks, Krystal 
Carver

BOYS GOLF: Dean Burns, 
John Williams, Joe Blair, Jerrid 
Vincent, Jason Tavarez

TRACK: Dean Burns, John 
Williams, Lee McCown, Scot 
Millican, Charles Hayes, Bart 
Goodman, Adam Morgan, Joe 
Blair, Jerrid Vincent

AND DO HEREBY express 
to each of the boys and girls 
the sincere appreciation and 
congratulations of the City of 
Robert Lee.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I 
have hereunto set my hand 
and caused the Seal of the 
City of Robert Lee, Texas to 
be affixed this the 26th day of 
May, 1994.

Jackie Walker 
Mayor, City of Robert Lee 

Attest: 
Kay Torres 

City Secretary

Team Penning
The Runnels Co. Horse 

Club will sponsor a team pen­
ning on June 4 at 8:00 pm in 
the Ballinger arena on Hwy. 
158 West. Books open at 
7:30 pm, close at 8:30 pm. 
For more information call: 365- 
3849 or 365-2466.

Did You Know?
Did you know that i f  you re ever away from  
your cellular phone from Texas Cellular, 
you can have all o f your calls forwarded or 
transferred to any other number'?
Well, now you know.

Other questions ? dlL"^
^ A n y t i m e «

TEXAS 
CELLULAR.
A sen/ice of Toylof Telecommunications, Inc.

Snyder
2403 West 25th Street
(915) 573-2424
Robert Lee 
824 Austin
(915) 453-2380

Sweetwater 
1901 Bristol
(915) 235-4377
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473-2065 473-2065

FCX3D STAMPS WELCOME 

Whole Boneless Top >

S i r l o i i T ^ " “ ""

473-2065

S '
OF BRONTE

OPEN
7 Days a Week

STORE HOURS
Mon.-Sat. --7:30 am to 8 pm 

Sunday — 8 am to 7 pm

P o rk

Spare Ribs
Market Made Pork

Sausage Lb

Lb.

L b .  
3-5 Lb. 

avg.

Sunday House Smoked

1.89 Turkey
Drumsticksi-b.

K  Decker Meat

^  Franks
" > “ . 6 9

Majesty Royal Gold Market Sliced

1.69 Cooked Ham tb. 2.49
^  Oscar Mayer All Meat

.¿ y  Bologna .9 9
Parade

Fruit Cocktail

”  6 9can ■

Hunt's Snack Pack

Pudding
4 pack

Parade

Evaporated Milk

2 / .89

Duncan Hines Chevyy Fudge

Brownies
19,8 oz. B

Duncan Hines Blueberry

Muffin Mix

” 1.49
S h u r f in e

Taco Shells
12  ct. .79

Louis Rich Kielbasa

Smoked Sausage
Hormel Little Sizzlers Mello Crisp

Links & Bacon
P a ttie s

12 8 9 8916 02. ■ w  W

¡Lay d

Potato Chips 6 oz. pkg.

Dr. Pepper & 
Pepsi C o ia^

6 pk. H
'^ '1 2  oz. cans I  p

Texsun Orange Asst. Flavors
or Pink GatoradeGrapefruit

^ I ^ J u i c e

46 0Z Q Q  
can ■  ^0 s “.  . 9 9

L ib b y s

Vienna Sausage

2 / . 8 95 oz. 
can

F r is k ie s

Cat Food 
5 . 9 99 Lb 

bag

No r t l ie rn

Bath Tissue
v r  1 . 4 9

Shu rf i ne

Picante Sauce
. 9 916 oz. 

ja r

Parade

Diapers
Medium - 30 ct. 
Large - 20 ct.

3.99

Gain Reg. or Bleach j

Laundry ^  
D etergent

M azó la  Corn O il

Margarine 3/$1
Parade S liced 16-24 slices

American Singies .9 9
Pop's Flour

Tortillas
Parkay Squeeze

Margarine

11 ct.

1 Lb.

.99

1.29
Iceberg

le ttu ce FRESH PRODUCE
Large

FROZEN FOOD
Tomatoes .4 9
Bananas 3'̂ '’̂
D 11 e c at

/$1
n u w w w 1

Potatoes 'bag .9 9
Broccol i . 8 9

Parade
Ice Cream
Shurfine
Pie Shells
Parade Asst. Flavors
Pizza

1/2 Gal. 
rnd. ctn.

10 oz.
2 ct. - 9"

1 . 9 9
. 7 9
. 7 9

Prices Good 6/2 Thru 6/8
FOOD STAMPS WELCOME

md
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c

BUY IT. 
SELL IT, 
FIND IT.

C L A S S I F I E D
FOR SALE

3 BR HOUSE, 2 BA, central 
heat & air, numerous extras, 
well-kept, large corner lot, 
trees, sprinkler system, 
garage, patio, and storage 
buildings.
2 BR, 1 BA house Bayview 
Estates
Mobile Home on 4 lots in 
Robert Lee.
3 LOTS on east side Hwy. 
158
NEW ON MARKET brick, 
3BR, 2 Bath, located on large 
lot, double carport and 
storage building.
ROCK BLDG plus 4 lots, 
Hwy. 208 at 6th St., Robert 
Lee.
2 BR/2 BA HOUSE in
Bronte, w/large kitchen. Lo­
cated on part of 4 lots. Car­
port & garage, storage build­
ing and fence. Owner must 
sell due to health and change 
of residency. Make an offer,

FOR SALE
1,573 sq. ft. building, located 
downtown Robert Lee next to 
J & B Lumber, $9,000. Call 
915-473-3131. 
_____________2.2a-tnc

WANT TO BUY
Wrangler jeans, 35-36 waist; 
32-36 length. 473-2326. 
____________ 43B-2tp

FOR SALE
JC Penney 5 blade ceiling fan 
with light. Used 1 year. 453- 
2703 or 453-2495. 
______________ 4.3-1 tP

CLASSIFIED 
ADVERTISING RATES

1st. In s e rt io n ...
20c Per Word 

($3.00 Minimum) 
2nd. and S ubsequen t 
In s e r t io n s . . .

16c Per Word 
($2.50 Minimum)

A d d itio n a l 50 c  
fo r  B lind  A ds  

C a rd s /T h a n k s .. .
20c Per Word 

Lega l N o tices...
20c Per Word

COPY DEADLINE
Class Ads..5 pm Tues. 

Display Ads..5 pm Tues. 
Classified Ads & Cards of 

Thanks are payable in 
ADVANCE unless customer 
carries regular account.

FO R  S A L E  
1.2 Acre Building 

Site - 12th & 
Laverne, 

Robert Lee. 
Contact David P. 

Dickensheets, 
453-4516 (day) - 

949-0960 (evening). 
$ 7 5 0 0 . 0 0

SHAFFER 
FUNERAL HOME
BRONTE ROBERT LEE 

473-3131 453-2424
MONUMENTS
D u p lic a tio n s  

C ustom  D esigns

C FOR RENT

FOR SALE j
FOR SALE

2 - 8000 BTU window unit air 
conditioners, 453-2493. 
 42-2tp_

FOR SALE
4 rooms, bath, lots of new re­
pair. 220 N. Franklin, Bronte, 
655-1347.
_____________41b-3tP

~FOR SALE OR TRADE
in Robert Lee, 4 BR, 2 1/2 
bath, 2 car garage, large living 
area with fireplace, atrium, 
skylights, ceiling fans, large 
finished basement. 453- 
2457.
_____________42-tnc

FOR SALE
3 BR/2 BA brick house in 
'Bronte. Double garage, stor­
age building and fence. 413 
Key, 473-2095. 
 40B-tnc

FOR SALE 
B ronte

Owner said " R e d u c e  
Price" 3 BR/2 1/2 BA, extra 
large.

Robert Lee

Residentiai lots ready for
construction.

Large home plus more!
New to market, call for details.

reasonably priced.

eOiOAL HOUSIHG
opportunity

ADAMS LAND & 
REALTY CO.

Phone 453-2723 or 
655-9429

Elsie Adams 453-2757

FOR SALE
2 bedroom, 1 bath, large den, 
double carport, furnished. 
819 S. Washington, Bronte. 
915-692-8918 
_____________43B:.tn.C

FISH FOR STOCKING
Channel Cat 6-8" $.75 each

1-3" $.75 each
Bluegill 1 -3 "$ .5 0  each
Hybrid Bluegill 1-3" $.50 each
Minnows $10 .50 /lb .
Grass Carp $12.00 each

Orders taken through 
June 20,1994.

Coke County SWCD 
11 E. 6th 

Robert Lee 
453-2623

2 BR - 1 1/2 BA
all-brick home for rent. One- 

car garage, central air, near 
school, $325. 915-453-
2226.
_____________41-tnc

LARGE 1 BR TRAILER
for rent, furnished, bills paid. 
No children or pets. 1518 
Washington, Robert Lee, 
453-4786.
_____________Mdns.

ONE OR TWO BED- 
, ROOM APARTMENTS 

FOR RENT
Taking applications Mon., 
Wed., and Fri., 9 am - 3 pm, 
Housing Authority of Robert 
Lee, 170 N. Bishop, 453- 
2912. Equal Housing Oppor­
tunity.
_____________16a-EOW

BRUNSON 
STORAGE UNITS
300 West Main 

Bronte
Call 473-2198 to rent

c GARAGE SALES

Elaine Lee 
4 5 3 - 2 9 9 5  
Laura E. Crenshaw 
4 5 3 - 2 7 6 1

FOR SALE
Queen Blue Heeler cow dog, 
$25.00. 473-2326. 
_____________43B-1tp

FOR LEASE OR SALE
established business oppor­
tunity in downtown Bronte. 
Sold as going concern or "do 
your own thing!" Perfect tim­
ing, with busy time just ap­
proaching. Main Street Mar­
ket. Phone 473-2701 day­
time, 473-5841 evenings. 
_____________32B-tnc

FOR SALE
Operating SNAPPER riding 
mower in medium condition. 
$100.00. See at 122 W. 
12th, Robert Lee. 
______________ 43-1 tp

3 DAY GARAGE SALE
22 12th Street, Robert Lee. 
Little bit of everything. Friday- 
Sunday, 8:00 am.
____________ 43-1 tP

HUGE GARAGE/ESTATE 
SALE

Saturday, June 4th, 9:00 am 
till? Furniture, antiques, bicy­
cles, pictures, lamps, dishes, 
better clothing, etc. Main 
Street Market, downtown 
Bronte.
_______________ 43B-.li£

J

Johnson’s 
Water Well 

S erv ice
Farm

Ranch Home 
Windmills & Pumps 

24 HR. SERVICE
6 5 8 - 6 0 3 9

or
6 5 5 - 0 3 7 9

RnV'S ROOTER
SEWER & DRAIN 

SERVICE  
20 Years 

E x p e r i e n c e  
Ray Atwater 

(915) 453-2420
Robert Lee, TX

D

ENGLAND'S 
CARPET CLEANING

professional service, truck- 
mounted cleaning system. 
Serving all Coke County. Call 
toll free 1-800-473-2807, 
Bronte. Free estimates. 
_____________28-tnc

D&L DOZER SERVICE
Larry Spivey, Owner-Opera­
tor. PO Box 160, Bronte, TX. 
Phone (Oak Creek Lake) 915^ 
743-2577.
___ _̂________ 21B-tnc

MISSING COW
Black corssbred 4 year old, 
Half Circle P brand and double 
under-bit in right ear. Could 
have calf. Missing from Ulmer 
Bird place. Call 453-2856 or 
453-2920.
_____________43i2tC

BASKETBALL CAMP
June 6-10, ages 9-15, boys 
and girls, held at Robert Lee 
High School, 8:30 am - 3:45 
pm. $35 tuition fee. Contact: 
Coach Kurt White, Box 562, 
Robert Lee, Texas 76945, 
(915) 453-4675 or (915) 453- 
2333.
________:____ 42-1tc

WINDOW UNITS
Donnie's Appliance. Time to 
service your window units 
residential and commercial, 
453-2188.
_____________38-tnc

DEBORAH FRAZEE 
ENGLAND

will be cutting hair at Ken­
neth's Cuts, 322 Hwy. 277, 
Bronte. M ondays on ly . 
Specializing in men's barber 
cuts, women's and children's 
cuts, styles, and perms. 
Shop - 473-2284, Home - 
473-2807. Deborah invites all 
her old customers to come by 
for a visit or come see Ken­
neth Tuesday thru Saturday. 
_____________37-tnc

[  CARD OF THANKS ]

PAM SHAFFER AND 
THE STAFF

of the Bronte Nursing Home 
wish to thank the Bronte Vol­
unteer Fire Department, 
Bronte Ambulance Service 
volunteers, and volunteers 
from the Bronte Community, 
for the quick response when 
the nursing home had an air 
conditioner struck by lightning 
last Wednesday evening. 
_______________ 43B-1tc

PECAN BAPTIST 
CHURCH

would like to thank the com­
munity for all the food sent for 
the Finis Harmon family. A 
very special thank you to 
Robert Lee Baptist Church for 
the use of their facilities for 
the service.
_____________43-1tc

C NOTICES

NOTICE
The City of Bronte will accept 
bids for the sale of a 1972 
Chevrolet tank truck. Vehicle 
can be inspected at 301 East 
Main Street. Sealed bids 
marked "Chevrolet Truck Bid" 
will be accepted until 5:00 pm, 
July 7, 1994. The City of 
Bronte reserves the right to 
accept or reject any and/or all 
bids.
_____________43B-2tc

]

BUY IT. 
SELL IT. 
FIND IT.

JOHNNY'S
BUILDING

SERUICE
Custom Homes 
& Remodeling 
Residential & 

Commercial

473-5751

c Mise 1

TREE AND 
YARD SPRAYING

spraying for pecan casebear- 
er, aphids, webworms, or any 
other pest that might invade 
your trees. Also, yard spray­
ing for fleas and ticks. Rea­
sonable rates - quality service. 
PBS Nursery - Ballinger - 365- 
3269, or nights - Donnie Bru­
ton 365-2372. 
_____________42-tnc

THE LITTLE BITTY AD

Political__Calendar
The O bserver/ 

E n t e r p r i s e
has been au thorized to  make 

the  fo llow ing  
announcem ents fo r the 

po litica l o ffice s  in 
Coke County.

Each cand idate  has paid to r 
his or her announcem ent and 

w ill se rve  as the ir own 
cam pa ign  treasu re r. A ll 

po litica l a d ve rtis ing , 
announcem ents, and prin ting 

is cash in advance.

17TH
CONGRESSIONAL 

DISTRICT U.S. 
R E P R E S E N T A T IV E
Charles Stenholm

COUNTY & 
D ISTRICT C LER K

Ettie Hubbard

COKE COUNTY 
JU D G E

Royce Lee

COKE COUNTY 
COMMISSIONER  

PRECIN CT 2
Billy Joe Luckett

COKE COUNTY 
JU STICE OF THE 

PEA C E, PR EC .
2, 4, & 5

Bruce Sonnenberg



Classifieds...

C NOTICES j
NEEDED

Part-time LVN on the 3-11 
shift. Very competitive salary, 
shift differential. Good bene­
fits, friendly and clean atmo­
sphere. Apply in person at 
Bronte Nursing Home, 900 S. 
State, Bronte, TX 76933. 
_________ 4jB-gtC

NEEDED
Part-time evening cook. 
Hours: 11:00 am to 7:30 pm. 
Also fill-in for vacations and 
call in. Good benefits and 
pleasant working conditions. 
Apply in person at Bronte 
Nursing Home, 900 S. State, 
Bronte, TX.
_____________43B-2tc

PUBLIC NOTICE 
ORDINANCE #280 
AMENDMENT TO 

ORDINANCE #263 
THE AMENDMENT TO 

ORDINANCE #263 is as 
follows:

ORDINANCE #263 of the 
City of Bronte, Texas, is here­
by amended by adding Sec­
tion 2 to read as follows: 
SECTION 2

Rates: The rates for sewer 
service for users of such ser­
vices outside the city limits of 
the City of Bronte, shall be as 
follows: Residential - $8.75 
per month.

IT IS FURTHER ORDAINED 
that said Amendment shall be 
effective as of May 20, 1994.

Passed and approved this 
5th day of May, 1994.

Attest: Pat Martlndale, City 
Secretary

Approved: Martin Lee, Mayor
_____________43B-1tc

NOTICE INVITING BIDS
Notice is hereby given that 
the heirs of Harvey Franklin 
Saunders and Bertie Cade 
Saunders will accept sealed 
bids for the purchase of the 
following property: 120 acres 
in the W. H. Donaghe Survey, 
Coke County, Texas, located 
in the vicinity of Oak Creek 
Lake.

The undersigned has been 
authorized to accept bids on 
behalf of the heirs on the fol­
lowing terms: All bids must be

in writing, returned to the un­
dersigned in a sealed enve­
lope. Minimum bid is $40,000 
in cash. The heirSjeserve the 
right to match any bid re­
ceived. Bids must be re­
ceived on or before July 5, 
1994 at 5:00 pm. We reserve 
the right to reject any and all 
bids.

Notice to the successful 
bidder will be by regular U. S. 
mail. Closing shall be held on 
or before August 5, 1994. 
You may contact the under­
signed for more information.

Mike Varnadore.
Coke County Abstract Co.

PO Box 69 
Robert Lee, TX 76945 

(915) 453-2049
____________ 4,2a-4tc

PUBLIC NOTICE 
THE CITY OF ROBERT LEE 
NOTIFIES ALL INTERESTED 
PARTIES:

Effective the week of Mon­
day, June 6, 1994 Landfill 
dates at the Robert Lee 
Landfill will be as follows: 
Tuesday, 1:00 pm - 5:00 pm; 
Saturday - 9:00 am - 5:00 pm.

___________43a-1tc
NEEDED

Certified nurses aides for the 
3-11 shift. Good salary, bene­
fits, friendly, clean atmo­
sphere. Apply in person at 
Bronte Nursing Home, 900 S. 
State, Bronte, TX. EOE 
—__________ 43B-2tc

Richards couple 
receive degrees
Conda and Tami Belew 

Richards received their Bach­
elor of Science degrees from 
Texas Tech in separate cere­
monies Saturday, May 14th at 
the Lubbock Municipal Coli­
seum. Tami received her 
Bachelor of Science degree 
in Human Development and 
Family Studies while Conda 
recieved his Bachelor of Ar­
chitecture in Design Special­
ization. They have moved to 
Abilene where Conda is em­
ployed with Tittle and Luther 
Partnership.

Attending the graduation 
ceremonies were Scotty, 
Peggy, and John Paul Belew 
of Winters, Effie Corley, Ben­
ny and Jackie Corley, Garland, 
Lana, Cody, Jade and Alisa 
Richards, all of Bronte, and C. 
O. and Nell Richards of 
Ballinger.
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Premier
COMMERCIHL STOCKER 
SPRNISH NRNNiE SRLE

PU R EBR ED  BO ER GOATS 
A LR EA D Y CONSIGNED

* 5 Adult Nannies
* 3 Adult Billies
* 3 Nannie Kids
* 3 Billie Kids
* 100 Recipients with purebred 
embryos
* 100 Nannies Bred Boer

10:00 am - Saturday, 
a t

Exotic

June 18, 1994

Castleberry Exotic Sale Facility 
Lampasas, Texas 

13 miles south on Hwy. 183
2 ,5 0 0  Already C onsign ed
(Spanish Nannies, se lected and sorted)

(O nly qua lity  nann ies se lling)
Also Accepting 

Boer Goat consignments
Purebloods - 1/2 Bloods - Spanish nannies bred Boer

Free Goat BBQ - Friday, June 17, 1994
For M ore In form ation C ontact: Trip le  C Ranch,

Rt. 2 Box 234B-1 Lam pasas, TX  76550 
512-556-8251 or 512-556-5910

S p e n c e  
F  is h i n  *

S t - ' ' '

Julian Herndon was 
the only birthday hon­
orée in the month of May 
at the Bronte Nursing 
Home.

The party was held on 
Friday, May 20th. Marie 
Smith was in charge of 
enterta inm ent. The 
Home Dem onstration  
Club was hostess for the 
party.

Lloyd Noland was cho­
sen May "Employee of 
the Month" by his fellow 
workers at the Bronte 
Nursing Home.

Lloyd has been em­
ployed since September 
'93 and works as janitor.

Personal
Clark and Mary Frances 

Glenn have returned to 
Bronte after spending two 
weeks in Houston where Clark 
was a patient in Methodist 
Hospital. He is making a good 
recovery after undergoing 
lung surgery.

On May 22, Mary Frances 
attended the Baccalaureate 
Service at Second Baptist, 
where their granddaughter, 
Danielle, was a participant.

Public Notice
On March 23, 1994, GTE and Contei 
(“The Companies") filed applications with 
the Public Utility Commission of Texas 
(“PUC") to restructure the Companies’ 
Switched Transport rate category and 
reduce the Carrier Common Line (CCL) 
charge of its Switched Access Service. 
The tariff sheets in GTE and Contel’s 
applications, if approved, will bring the 
Companies’ state access tariffs into struc­
tural parity with their interstate tariffs for 
the Local Transport rate category, which 
became effective on December30,1993.

GTE and Contel propose to implement 
the new tariffs on a revenue neutral 
basis. The Local Transport category of 
GTE and Contel’s Switched Access Ser­
vice is primarily for Interexchange carri­
ers.

Persons who wish to intervene should 
file a motion for intervention with the 
PUC by June 17,1994 with reference to 
Docket No. 12866 (GTE) and/or 12865 
(Contel). Requests for further informa­
tion should be mailed to the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas, 7800 Shoal Creek 
Boulevard, Suite 400N, Austin, Texas 
78757, or call the Public Utility Commis­
sion Public Information Office at (512) 
458-0223 or (512) 458-0227 or (512) 
458-0221 teletypewriter for the deaf.

m
Water Temp - 71

Kermit Bass Club - (2 day 
tournament)

The first day Big Bass went 
to Donny Langley. His catch 
weighed in at 7 lbs. 9 oz.

First place - Danny Langley 
with 3 bass at 15 lbs. 15 oz; 
Second place - Billy Fine with 
3 bass - 9 lbs. 6 oz.; Third 
place - Ray Christian 3 bass, 7 
lbs. 8 oz.

The second day Big Bass 
went to David Miller, weighing 
in at 5 lbs. 7 oz.

First place - David Miller, 2 
bass, 10 lbs. 12 oz.; Second 
place - Dalton Arnold, 3 bass, 
7 lbs. 15 oz.; Third place - Bob 
Thurman, 3 bass, 5 lbs.

There were 41 entries with 
53 black bass reeled in. All 
black bass were released.

Wildcat Marina 
Jerry Green - Midland, TX, one 
10 1/2 lb. striper.
Vernon Lewis - Midland, TX, 
one 6 1/2 lb. striper.
Linda and Jerry Green - Mid­
land, TX, 15 stripers from 3 
1/2 lbs. up to 6 lbs.

Paint Creek Marina 
Paul Cox - Midland, TX, reeled 
in a 3 3/4 lb. black bass on a 
green Slugo.
Rick Giles. Don Kirkpatrick, 
and Paul Lane - from San An­
gelo, TX, reeled in 11 stripers 
trolling.
Daniel Justise - from Midland, 
TX, reeled in a 7.5 lb. black 
bass on a tequila worm.
Ronald Wilson - from Odessa, 
TX, reeled in a 10 lb. striper on 
a jig and plastic worm.
Dennis & Donna Thomas - 
from Odessa, TX, reeled in 
several stripers with a total of 
40 lbs. trolling with white jigs. 
Jimmy Mvers - from Kermit, 
TX, reeled in a 2 1/2 lb. black 
bass on a rattle trap.
Ronald Wilson and Allen Wil­
son - from Odessa, TX, reeled 
in 7 stripers a total of 22 lbs.. 
Ronnie Brown -from Odessa, 
TX, reeled In a 9 lb. 1 oz black 
bass.
Paul Lane - from San Angelo, 
TX, reeled in 5 stripers trolling, 
a total of 25 lbs.

Local ASU
Dean’s List

Area students attending 
Angelo State University in 
San Angelo, are listed on the 
Dean's List for the Spring 
semester at the University.

Those listed include 
Douglas Bruce Cooper, a 
Computer Science major, 
Eloise Walker, a Sociology 
m a jo r ,She r le  Denise 
W ilk inson, a Special 
Education major all from 
Blackwell, Amy Joelle Allen, 
an Undecided major, Julie 
Ruth Blair, a Nursing major, 
Billy Joe Magness, a 
Kinesiology major, Jennifer 
Lynn Robinson, a Kinesiology 
major, and Kelly Ann Webb, a 
Psychology major all from 
Bronte.

To be eligible for the Dean's 
List, a student must be 
enrolled as a full time student 
and have at least a 3.25 grade 
point average.

Singing Winds 
re s u lts

Results of the 2 Person 27 
Hole Tournament held May 28 
at Singing Winds Golf Course 
in Bronte are as follows.

Championship 
1st. - Keith McCutchen and 
Jerry McCutchen, 100; 2nd. 
Junior Garcia and Philip Es­
quivel, 102; 3rd. - Martin 
Basquez and Wayne Coalson, 
105.

First Flight
1st. - Sue Caudle and J.W. 
Caudle, 108; 2nd. Ed Martin- 
dale and Wade Stautzen- 
berger. 111; 3rd. Tom Ensor 
and Barry Corley, 112.

Second Flight 
1st. Mickey Pierce and Mike 
Johnson, 112; 2nd. Connie 
Gibbs and Donnie Gibbs, 112; 
3rd. Winston Modgling and 
Tom Modgling, 116.

Third Flight
1st. Kelly Byrd and Scotty 
Chastain, 112; Ken and Katie 
Campbell, 118; 3rd. Richard 
Hembree and Leon McFerrin, 
121 .

The next tournament will be 
an ABC tourney to be held 
June 12.

R a in fa ll
m easurem ents

Last week was a rainy week 
in Bronte. Rainfall accumula­
tions varied from 5.6 inches to 
6.4 inches and the week be­
fore, 7.1 inches was mea­
sured in Bronte. Hail covered 
the ground around midnight 
Friday morning.

On Wednesday night the 
power was out for over an 
hour in Bronte. Lightning 
struck an air conditioner at 
Bronte Nursing Home. The 
fire siren would not work for 
some time. A series of phone 
calls brought volunteers from 
fire department, ambulance 
service and volunteers to help 
in the evacuation of nursing 
home residents to the front 
porch, lobby and dining room.

After about an hour, all pa­
tients were taken back to their 
rooms. Power returned about 
9:15 p.m. with repair on the 
cooling system being made.

Maintenance supervisor, 
George Eubanks, finally had 
to use the old emergency 
phone since all were out for 
awhile.

Personal
On Saturday, Sunday and 

Monday, May 21,.22, 23 the 
Adams brothers and sisters 
gathered for a reunión in the 
home of Ralph and Lucille 
Weeks In Brownwood, Texas. 
Also celebrated was the 75th 
birthday of Clyde Adams of 
Bronte, Texas.

Attending were: Haze l  
Caulder, Bronte; C ly d e  
Adams, Bronte; Woodie and 
Jessie Allen, Midland; Delbert 
and Dean Adams, Midland; 
Homer and Ann Adams, 
Evant; Lloyd and Betty Lou 
Adams, Midland;Dalton and 
Gladys Millican, Silver; Ralph 
and Lucille Weeks, Brown- 
wood; Jim and Evelyn Bag- 
well, Sulphur Springs.

These are the 10 children of 
the late Mrs. Onie Adams, 
former resident of Bronte 
Nursing Home. Lots of good 
food was enjoyed by all, some 
good 88 playing, most impor­
tant was the love and com­
panionship shared by these 
10 brothers and sisters and 
spouses.



Page 12 Friday, June 3, 1994 The Observer/Enterprise

Jameson named to 
trustee award

Tiffany Jameson of Silver, 
daughter of Larry and Barbara 
Jameson, was honored with 
the Trustee's award from Abi­
lene Christian University.

The Trustee's award is giv­
en each year to students for 
the honor and recognition 
they have brought to ACU 
through their achievements 
and character.

Jameson received a bach­
elor's degree in human com­
munication. At ACU Jameson 
was a member of Tri Kappa 
Gamma women's social club, 
W Club women's honor orga­
nization, Omega Rho Alpha, 
Phi Eta Sigma, Alpha Chi. 
She was president of Lambda 
Pi Eta in 1993-94. She re­
ceived academic, valedictori­
an and leadership scholar­
ships to ACU. Jameson par­
ticipated in Welcome Week, 
Sing Song, Freshman Follies, 
Spring Break Campaigns and 
Wildcat Kids. She was an 
ACU cheerleader and cur­
rently teaches an aerobics 
class at ACU and the YMCA. 
She also tutors international 
students and taught a 4th 
grade class at University 
Church of Christ.

ACU is private university af­
filiated with the churches of 
Christ with an enrollment of 
more than 4,000 students, 
making it one of the largest 
private universities in the 
Southwest. The campus, lo­
cated 150 miles west of Dal- 
las/Ft. Worth, has been rec­
ognized by the independent 
Colleges and Universities of 
Texas as part of a statewide 
model ^or efficiency and inno­
vative programs to keep down 
the costs of higher education.

The university offers 117 
bachelor's programs through 
its three colleges. Arts and 
Sciences, Biblical and Family 
Studies and Business, and 
the School of Nursing. The 
ACU Graduate School offers

Personal
We, Raymond and Gertie 

Bloodworth of Silver, ac­
companied our son, Charles, 
and wife Dena on a trip to Ari­
zona. Points of interest were 
Clines Corner, Yellow Horse 
Trading Post, where we met 
Ron Yellow Horse whose 
grandfather. Chief Yellow 
Horse, sold goods from a 
wagon at this location, - the 
painted desert, petrified for­
est, Indian Ruins, Newspaper 
Rock and the Badlands. We 
saw beautiful mountains,  
some snow-capped, then on 
to the majestic Grand Canyon. 
We now know why it is one of 
the seven wonders of the 
world. We toured the 
Canyon, enjoying its beauty, 
then traveled on to Globe, 
Arizona where we helped my 
uncle. Jack Brown, celebrate 
his 90th birthday on May 4th.

Our next step was Tomb­
stone, Arizona, a very in­
teresting little town. Boot Hill, 
the OK Corral, and a special 
gun fight for "Cinco De Mayo" 
were special attractions. We 
saw the world's largest rose 
bush which covers 700 
square feet.

The KOA camps where we 
stayed were so nice. It was a 
wonderful vacation but it is al­
ways nice to get home to dear 
ole Coke County - the green­
est place we had seen on the 
whole trip.

39 master's programs and one 
doctoral program. For more 
information about ACU, call 
toll-free 1-800-888-0228 or in 
Abilene 674-2000.

Personal
Mrs. Cecil Kemp of Bronte 

was in Wilton, Connecticut last 
week visiting her daughter, 
Mrs. Carolyn Marcato and chil­
dren, Robin Sue and Bob 
Marcato and friends.

While there, she attended 
the festivities of graduation for 
her granddaughter, Robin 
Sue Marcato, who received a 
BS degree in Massive Com­
munications from Emerson 
College in Boston, Mass.

Robin is the daughter of 
Carolyn Marcato and the late 
Robert Marcato of Wilton, 
Connecticut and the grand­
daughter of Mrs. Kemp and 
the late Cecil Kemp of Bronte.

Injury Prevention
To prevent running injuries, 

pay attention to the four "S's": 
stretching, stride, shoes, and 
surface.

"Many of the common 
running injuries can be pre­
vented by simple adjustments 
in your running program or 
even a new pair of shoes," 
said Dr. Donald Baxter, a clini­
cal professor of orthopedic 
surgery at Baylor College of 
Medicine in Houston.

"A full 10 or 15 minutes 
should be devoted to care­
fully stretching thigh and calf 
muscles," Baxter said.

A simple adjustment in 
stride may be necessary if 
aches and pains develop.

"A very long stride m ay 
cause the runner to land too 
far back on the heel, causing 
injuries to the ankle, achilles 
tendon and arch," Baxter said. 
"Taking extremely short 
strides may strain calf and 
thigh muscles or stress the 
foot and ankle."

An exercise physiologist 
can analyze stride on station­
ary tracks using video tape to 
pick up flaws in motion.

The third "S", shoes, is in­
timidating to many people be­
cause of the number of spe­
cialty running shoes on the 
market.

"Many of these shoes are 
expensive," said Baxter.  
"But, when fitted and cared 
for properly, the shoes can 
help prevent injuries. The key 
is finding the right kind of 
shoe."

Baxter suggests taking 
along an old pair of running 
shoes so a sales representa­
tive can see how you run.

Selecting the proper run­
ning surface is also important. 
Surfaces such as concrete 
roads and sidewalks can 
cause shin splints, minute 
fractures in the bone below 
the knee.

"Even the most expensive 
shoes cannot eliminate all of 
the shock waves caused by 
constant running on that type 
of surface," Baxter said.

Baxter suggests a relatively 
smooth-surface track or run­
ning trail. Even aspha l t  
streets are softer than con­
crete.

Baxter also recommends 
cross-training.

Replacing one or two days 
of running with cycling or 
swimming gives certain mus­
cle groups a rest while still 
providing a good aerobic 
workout.

AON Elects /T o ií¿  CqJ

O ffic e rs
Members met for their May 

meeting in the home of Jana 
Smith's mother, Melba 
Mauldin. Plans for the lun­
cheon were discussed. The 
end of the year dinner was 
also discussed. New officers 
were elected. They are: 
President, Tammy Roe; Vice- 
President, Linda Eaton; Sec­
retary, Dianna McCabe; Trea­
surer, Cynthia Hill. Linda 
Burns presented a program 
entitled, "I have learned 
that...." Member enjoyed re­
freshments afterwards. The 
June meeting will be held in 
the home of Linda Burns.

ASU Graduates
Three Bronte students at 

Angelo State University were 
among 557 students to re­
ceive degrees during the 
Spring commencement at the 
university.

Melanie M. Allen received 
an Associate of Applied 
Science, with a major in 
Nursing, Quinda Quinette Feil 
received a Master of Public 
Administration, with a major in 
Public Administration, and 
Kelly Ann Webb received a 
Bachelor of Science, with a 
major in Psychology.

C O U M T  RV A g e NT5'^ 

_______ H ^ W £ __________ }

by Tommy Antilley 
Coke County Agent

Pecan Nut 
C asebearer 

C ontro l
With the crazy weather and 

variations in temperature this 
spring, precise prediction for 
control of the pecan nut 
casebearer will be difficult. 
Unless there is a tremendous 
load of casebearer eggs pre­
sent on the nutlets, it is sug­
gested not to spray for control 
of casebearers for several 
reasons. One, with the pos­
sible heavy crop of nuts that it 
looks like we may have, some 
thinning will have to take place 
or your nuts will not fill out 
completely. It is better to have 
fewer nuts that are filled out 
completely than a tremen­
dous load that is only half- 
filled. Also, if you spray when 
there is little or no casebearer 
eggs present,  besides 
wasting money and time you 
will damage the beneficial 
population of insects that will 
help us down the road on 
aphids, etc. Yellow pecan

aphid is a much larger pest for 
our area than the pecan nut 
casebearer.

The estimated spray dates 
for control should be warrant­
ed by a heavy egg population 
between May 26 and June 2. 
Only spray if you can find nu­
merous eggs. These will be 
on the ends of the small nut­
lets and will be white in color 
and about the size of a pin 
head. Unless there are 
around 20 percent of the 
nutlets infested with eggs, I 
would suggest not spraying.

If there are any questions, 
please call the County Exten­
sion office at 453-2461.

SUPPORT

It Works Wonders. 

American Heart Association


