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Coke County Rodeo slated 
for Bronte July 16 & 17
Coke County Rodeo Asso­

ciation will hold its annual 
rodeo July 16th and 17th at 
the Bronte Arena. Perfor­
mances begin at 7 pm each 
night. There will be all around 
prizes given in each age 
group; these will be Poco- 
made Ranger-style buckles. 
Entry deadline is July 10, at 
12 noon.

The 2nd Annual Business­
men's Steer Riding will be 
featured again this year on 
Friday night of the Rodeo, the

16th. Three man teams will 
have an entry fee of $5.00 per 
team. You must furnish sad­
dle, halter and rope. Plaques 
will be given to each winning 
team member. Enter Friday 
night of the rodeo.

There will also be a 6 & Un­
der boys and girls goat riding. 
There is a $5.00 entry fee and 
trophies will be awarded for 
first through third place.

For more information or en­
try blanks, contact 453-4751 
or 453-2230.

Stenholms plan reception 
In new San Angelo office

Congressman Charles W. 
Stenholm (D-Texas) and Mrs. 
Stenholm will host an open 
house reception in the re­
cently-opened district office, 
located in the O. C. Fisher 
Building at 33 East Twohig, 
Suite 318 in San Angelo on 
Friday, July 2 from 12:00 
noon to 1:30 pm. A Town Hall 
meeting will take place from 
1:30 pm until 3:00 pm follow­
ing the reception.

The new district office will

assist constituents with indi­
vidual problems dealing with 
Housing and Urban Develop­
ment (HUD), academy ap­
pointments, child support, 
postal operations, veterans 
affairs and Champús, as well 
as serve as a liaison between 
Washington, DC and the 
southern-most region of the 
17th Congressional District of 
Texas.

Everyone is invited to at­
tend both events.

Enjoying the annual reunion Saturday of 
their Sterling City graduating class were 
(standing, l-r) Lucile Bryan, W. J. Benge, 
Wanda Becker, (seated, l-r) Hazel Beam, Ed- 
wina Cope, and Doris Durham.

SC Class of '28 reunited in Robert Lee
by Jeffie Roberts

Six surviving 1928 Gradu­
ates of Sterling City High 
School met in reunion at the 
Wilson Bryan Family recre-

Courthouse Closed
The Coke County Court­

house in Robert Lee will close 
on Monday, July 5, in obser­
vance of the Independence 
Day holiday.

"Hope For
The Family"

"Hope For The Family" will 
be shown at the Robert Lee 
Baptist Church on Sunday 
evening, June 27, at 7:00. 
This movie relates the story of 
how one family struggles to 
stay together. Through 
heartache and division, they 
finally realize what it takes for 
them to be reunited. Every­
one is welcome.

BHS Reunion
Bronte High School classes 

of '53, '54, '55, '56, '57, and 
'58 are having a joint reunion 
in the Bronte community cen­
ter on Saturday, June 26. 
There will be open visitation at

Upcoming
1:00 pm. These classes 
would like for everyone who is 
interested to come by to visit. 
This includes teachers, par­
ents, siblings, and anyone 
else.
BNH July 4th Bash

The Bronte Nursing Home 
will celebrate the 4th of July 
again this year with fireworks 
and an Ice Cream Supper.

The Ice Cream Supper will 
start at 7:30 pm on the night 
of July 5. Fireworks will follow 
at 9:00 pm.

Red Canyon 
Archery Club

Red Canyon Archery Club 
will sponsor the 1993 3-D 
Invitational on Saturday, June 
26, 10:00 am - 2:00 pm, Cali­
fornia Start and Sunday, June 
27th, 10:00 am. Shotgun 
Start. The practice range will 
open both days at 8:00 am.

For more information, call 
Reggie Phillips (915) 453-

4756, Glen Heard (915) 453- 
2749, J. P. Skipworth 
(915)453-2031, or Jeff Eu­
banks (915)453-2475.

CC Associations 
to Meet

The Coke County Rodeo 
Association and the Coke 
County Roping Club will join in 
a combined meeting, Friday, 
June 25, at 5:30 pm at the 
arena in Bronte. Issues per­
taining to both club's activities 
need to be discussed. A 
double playday will follow at 7 
pm.

Mt. Creek Golf
Saturday, July 10 a Jr. 

Tournament will be hosted by 
Mountain Creek Golf Course 
in Robert Lee. The tourney 
will be open to players ages 8 
through 18.

For more information or to 
sign up for the tourney call 
453-2317 or 1-800-994- 
6531.

ation cottage, known as 
"Bryan's Barn", one mile west 
of Robert Lee. The reunion 
was held Saturday, June 19, 
1993, and the six considered 
a fair attendance since it had 
been 65 years since their 
graduation.

The Class of 1928, the  
largest ever to graduate from 
Sterling City High School, has 
had regular reunions ever 
since, and survivors vow to do 
so until only one is left. All fu­
ture meetings are planned to 
be held at "The Bryan's Barn" 
so Lucile Bryan, former Class 
President, plans to be that last 
one in order to continue be­
ing hostess.

Nine of the eleven girls of 
the Class of 1928 are living of 
which five were present for 
the June 19 reunion. They 
are Edwina (Bynum) Cope, 
Sterling City; Hazel (Edwards) 
Beam, Boerne; Doris 
(Crawford) Durham, San An­
gelo; Wanda (Collins) Becker; 
San Angelo; and L u c ile  

, (McWhorter) Bryan, Robert 
Lee. Absent were: Helen 
(Wade) Drake, Fort Worth; 
Avis (Askey) Logan, McKin­
ney; Helen McCabe, Arvada, 
Colorado; and E ve lynne  
(Stamps) Murray, Houston.

Two of the original 12 boys 
are living with only one, W. Y. 
Benge, of Sterling City, pre­

sent. Audie Peays of Vacav­
ille, California, was unable to 
attend.

Also, present were two 
wives of deceased c lass  
members, Mrs. Lawrence 
Davis (Eloise) of Coahoma, 
and Mrs. Ruth Collins Shook, 
widow of Claude Collins, Jr., 
of San Angelo. Rebecca 
(Durham) Phy of Belton ac­
companied her mother. Tom­
my Doris (Crawford) Durham. 
Wison Bryan, co-host with 
Lucile, was the only husband 
attending. Jeffie Roberts of 
Robert Lee served as 
photographer and reporter for 
the reunion.

Ten people participated in 
the famous fish cuisine 
catered by Chris Estresvaag's 
Cracker Barrel of Robert Lee.

Even-numbered years have 
been the regular m eeting 
times but it was decided in 
1992 to gather for the reunion 
each year. The next Is 
planned for June 18, 1994, at 
the "Bryan's Barn".

Deceased class members 
remembered and missed 
were: Mary Stone, James 
Conger, Vernon Ph illips, 
Truman Davis, Guinn Welch, 
Ross Welch, Worth Durham, 
James Rushing, G ladys  
(Copeland) Newcomb, and 
the class sponsor. Miss John­
nie Weyerts.
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Obituaries

M illic a n
Funeral services were held 

at 3 pm Sunday, June 20, in 
the Silver Baptist Church for 
Francis Clifton "Son" Millican. 
Burial followed in the Robert 
Lee Cemetery, directed by 
Shaffer Funeral Home. The 
Rev. R. W. Blackmon, pastor 
of the church, officiated the 
services. Pallbearers for the 
services included Dub Met­
calf, Don Sparks, Larry Milli­
can, Homer Millican, A. B. 
Jennings, and R o c k y  
Reynolds.

Mr. Millican, 76, died of an 
apparent heart attack Friday, 
June 18, suffered en route to 
Colorado City from his home 
at Silver. He was alone and 
was found in his pickup just 
inside a nearby pasture.

He was born January 3, 
1917 in the Cedar Hill com­
munity, south of Silver in 
Coke County. The families of 
both his parents, David Mon­
roe Millican and Mary Ann 
Tubb, came to West Coke 
County near the turn of the 
century. Son was a lifelong 
resident of the county except 
for a short time spent in 
Arkansas and his-service in 
the Army Air Corp during 
World War II.

He was married to Lorene 
Johnson in San Angelo Au­
gust 15, 1938 and they spent 
their married life at Silver. He 
was a member of the Silver 
Baptist Church and a retired 
rancher and oilfield pumper.

Son's survivors include his 
wife, Lorene, of the home; 
five children and their spous­
es, Bobby and Lisa Millican, 
David and Theresa Millican, all 
of Robert Lee, Clifton and Ida 
Millican of Elida, New Mexico, 
Frankie and Royce Hood of 
Robert Lee, and Jo Ann 
Carter of Kemp; seven 
grandchildren, Gaye Lynn 
Reynolds, Jana Demere, Ed­
die Hood, Bobby Millican, Jr., 
Robbye Millican, David Milli­
can, Jr., Justin Chance Milli­
can; two step-grandchildren, 
Chris and Crystal Marquez; 
five g rea t-g randch ild ren .

PARKER PLUMBING
Residential-Commercial 

All Types Plumbing Repair

, *New C onstruction  
♦ R em od elin g  
♦ F ix tu res
♦Sewer S e r v ic e \:3 ^ ^ ^  

Licensed Master Plumber

473-2131 Bronte

Michael, Brandi, and Matthew 
Reynolds, Shanna Demere, 
and Deesa Hood; and three 
brothers, Dalton Millican and 
Bunyon Millican of Silver, and 
Gerald Millican of Hobbs, New 
Mexico.

He was preceded in death 
by one son, James Millican.

Forbus
Private memorial services 

were held on Thursday, June 
17, for James Douglass For­
bus, 83, of Kerrville, who died 
Tuesday, June 15 In a Ker­
rville hospital. Dr. John Platt 
officiated.

Burial was in Garden of 
Memories Cemetery in Ker­
rville under the direction of 
Grimes Funeral Chapel of 
Kerrville.

Mr. Forbus was born on Oct. 
7, 1909 to the late George 
and Ethel Turner Forbus In 
Norton, Texas. He had been 
a resident of Kerrville since 
1976. He was a production 
maintenance engineer for 
many years in several of the 
Celanese C o rp o ra t io n  
C h e m ica l and P la s t ic s  
production facilities, and re­
tired from Hoechst Celanese 
Plastic Division in Baytown.

For several years in the 
1940's he was with the Happy 
ISD as a teacher and director 
of the Uncle Sam Band. They 
led many parades and partici­
pated in numerous events 
throughout Texas.

He was in the first graduat­
ing class in Norton High 
School and also played in the 
Ballinger band under the di­
rection of Mr. Anderson, early 
Ballinger Band Director.

He was preceded in death 
by his wife, Ruth M a rtin  
Forbus in 1989.

He married Dorothy Lee 
Nutter of Bronte in 1990.

Survivors include his wife, 
Dorothy; two sons and

... Obituaries ct'd.

daughters-in-law, James E. 
and Elin Forbus of Kerrville 
and Robert D. and Elizabeth 
of Plano; two sisters, Lena 
Walberg of Happy and Cecile 
Whitmon of Castle Rock, 
Colo.; a brother, Joe Ed For­
bus of Kerrville; a stepdaugh­
ter and husband, Janey and 
Paul McCallum and their five 
children of Grapevine; several 
grandchildren; one great- 
grandson and num erous 
nieces and nephews.

Farm Bureau 
S cho larsh ip  

Winner Named
Coke-Sterling Farm Bureau 

began an annual Scholarship 
Fund program by announcing 
the first recipient of the $500 
award. John Andrew Fluh- 
mann of Robert Lee High 
School was chosen to receive 
te 1993 award - John is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Fluhmann.

The program will include 
graduating seniors from 
Robert Lee, Bronte, and 
Sterling City who plan to at­
tend a school of higher edu­
cation, and who are members, 
or whose parents are mem­
bers of Coke-Sterling Farm 
Bureau.

ECC EMS 
M em oria ls

The following donations 
and memorials were made to 
the East Coke County EMS 
during the month of May.

Donations 
Royce Fancher

Memorials 
Dorothy Treadwell 
Bronte Extension Homemak­
ers
Minnie Wrinkle 
Virginia Boatright 
Henry Raney 
Virginia Boatright 
Juan Basquez 
Gilbert Basquez 
Zell Peters 
Emogene Thornton 
Tom Watson 
Wayman and Hazel Percifull

Big Lake
4th Celebration
The Big Lake Chamber of 

Commerce will sponsor a 
community-wide July 4 Festi­
val on Saturday and Sunday, 
July 3 & 4. Saturday will fea­
ture a parade, games, food, 
fajita cookoff, tennis and vol­
leyball tournaments and a 
dance. Sunday's activities will 
include community church 
services, a barbecue, races 
and games, bicycle parade 
and rodeo, kite flying, tennis, 
and volleyball.

£C  s f ia n c h e r ò  S f i e s t a u r a n t
M exican-A m erican Food 

Open Tues.-Sat. 11 am-2 pm & 5-9 pm
224 W. Main Bronte 473-2140

J im  L a m m e r s ^ L X r a f t s m a n
New c o n s t r u c t i o n  -  R e m o d e lin g

C o m m e r c ia l R e s i d e n t i a l
C a r p e n t r y C o n c r e t e
P a i n t i n g S h e e t r o c k

S i d i n g  - R o o f i n g
Property Management for #^sentee Otvners

Phone: 473-2114 Bronte, Texas

Sunny 
Notes 

from the 
Bronte 
Senior 
C enter

Rural Public 
Transportation

Are you aware that every 
Tuesday the "TRAX" van 
goes to San Angelo? You do 
not have to be a senior citizen 
to ride the van. All you need 
to do is call Fayne Thorn at 
473-6471 by noon on Mon­
day to make reservations. If 
you are over 60 you are asked 
to make a donation and if you 
are under 60 there is a fee 
that is required. Call the 
Bronte Senior Center for 
more information. Medical 
appointments, social service 
agencies, government agen­
cies and shopping in that or­
der are our priority. The van is 
air conditioned and quite 
comfortable. Give us a call.

Ice Cream Social
All senior citizens are invited 

to Aubrey and Zada Denman's 
home for homemade ice 
cream and goodies. The 
event is planned for Thurs­
day, July 1 at 6:30 at the 
Denman Ranch on Hayrick 
Road. If you are able and 
would like to bring homemade 
ice cream call the Bronte 
Center and let us know. If not 
bring goodies to go along with 
the ice cream. Transportation 
will be provided if you call the 
Center by Wednesday, June 
30.

Free Health Screening
for Low Income Men

Our Area Agency on Aging 
has given Coke County funds 
for health screenings. Ar­
rangements have been made 
for low income men to have 
the PSA test, which is a blood 
test which measures a sub­
stance in the blood called 
Prostrate Specific Antigens. 
PSA blood levels increase in 
cases of prostate cancer and 
other prostate diseases. The 
test is used to confirm a diag­
nosis of prostate cancer, to 
monitor response to therapy 
and screen for recurrence. If 
you are over 65 and think you 
might qualify call Mary Percifull 
at the Bronte Senior Center 
and get more details. This 
blood test will be taken at 
Shamrock Clinic in Robert Lee

at no cost to you. This service 
will be provided in both 
Bronte and Robert Lee. 
Bronte Senior Center 
will be closed Monday, 
July 5.

Meals for the Week 
Monday, June 28

Country Fried Steak 
White Sauce 
Creamed Corn 
Brussel Sprouts 
Bread
Diced Pineapple 

Wednesday, June 30
Sweet & Sour Pork 
Rice
Green Peas 
Cornbread 
Peach Half 
Brownie w/nuts

Friday, July 2 
Burrito w/chili 
Pinto Beans 
Jalapeno
Creamy Cabbage/Carrot Slaw 
Pear Half in Jello

Poehls
"D istingu ished  

Student" at TSU
Stephanie Poehls, daugh­

ter of Coach and Mrs. Ed 
Poehls of Robert Lee, has 
been notified that she has 
been named a "Distinguished 
Student" by Tarieton State 
University. The honor is one 
of the highest centered on 
students at the University. 
She has also maintained a 4.0 
grade point average.

Robert C. Fain, vice presi­
dent for academic affairs, ex­
pressed his congratulations in 
a letter and continued, "This 
distinction is the Universities 
way of honoring your aca­
demic achievements and rec­
ognizing your importance on 
campus. The faculty and ad­
ministration salute you and 
look forward to your contin­
ued success".

"Anguished English" 
"For Sale: Antique 

Desk suitable for lady  
with thick legs and large 
drawers."

Thanks Coke County
Rodeo Sponsors
for your support.

Robert Lee State Bank Bob Wrinkle's
First National Bank Ace Hardware

in Bronte Shaffer M onument Co.
Ways Co. Chevron Ivey Motor Co.

Distributor J&B Lumber
W.E.B. Construction Key Feed Store

Skinner's Gro. Lone Star Roper
Super H Gro.

WINK INSURANCE AGENCY
H om e*A uto

L lfe *H e a lth *C o m m e rc la l 

715 A u stin  - 453-4551
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Jim Kahiig o f San Angelo and Carol Dela- 
mater of Kansas (r) look amused as Bill Terry of 
White Oak hugs a mechanical hula girl at the 
Spieker Reunion June 12.

Spieker descendents reunite in Bronte
When the 68 descendents 

of Fred and Alma Spieker ar­
rived at the Bronte Communi­
ty Center Saturday, June 
12th, they couldn't believe 
they were not in Hawaii. The 
building was beautifully deco­
rated in Hawaii theme with 
flowers and fruit everywhere. 
They were greeted with an 
aloha from hostess Jim and 
Norma Kahiig. Luau and shell 
beads that were brought back 
from Hawaii by S p ieker's  
great-granddaughter, Carol 
Delamater were given to all 
the ladies and girls, the  
biggest attraction was two 
mechanical Hula girls or 
dancers furnished by a great- 
grandson, Calvin Wanoreck, 
salesperson from San 
Angelo, Texas. Everyone 
wanted their picture made 
with the girls (especially the 
men).

P arker-M cG in n is
Wedding

Michelle Irene Parker and 
John Bowie McGinnis were 
married May 22, 1993 at Holy 
Angels Catholic Church. The 
Rev. Serran Braun officiated.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. John P. Parker, 
Jr., of San Angelo and Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Sidney McGinnis 
of Bronte.

Maid of Honor was Shannon 
Godfrey. Bridesmaids were 
Belinda Davis and Lisa Davis, 
both of Ft. Worth, Misti Stover 
of Abilene, Maggie Parker, 
Jennifer Parker, Christina 
Parker and V a le rie  
Schmiedekamp. Flower girls 
were Anna Parker and Kylia 
McGinnis.

Best man was Lee Daulong 
of Bronte. Groomsmen were 
Blain McGinnis of Valdosta, 
Georgia, Blair McGinnis of 
Lubbock, Bobby McCarthy of 
Ft. Worth, Jake Bontatibus of 
Abilene, Chris Lopez, Mike 
Jamar and Kirby Hartman. 
Ring bearer was Albert 
Michael Bravo.

Ushers were Terry Freatman 
and Bill Stover.

Mrs. McGinnis is a 1989 
graduate of San Angelo Cen­
tral High School.

Her husband is a 1987 
graduate of Bronte H igh 
School.

"Anguished English"
"The first thing they do  

when a baby is born is  
cut its  biblical cord."

Fred and Alma came to Tom 
Green County in 1924 and 
settled with their seven chil­
dren on a farm near Veribest, 
Texas. In 1934 they bought 
land in the Wall community 
and spent the rest of the ir 
lives there. There are three 
children surviving, Alma 
Wanoreck of San Angelo, 
Fritz Spieker of Ballinger, and 
Dora Gallaway of Bronte, 
Texas.

There was singing and mu­
sic before the luau. Accordian 
player was Lorine Fuessel 
Mareitta Oats from San An­
gelo, Fritz Spieker from 
Ballinger, p layed the 
harmonica, and Dora Gallaway 
played the piano and accor­
dian. Roast pig, fried chicken, 
all the trimmings, salad, and 
dessert were served. Fruit 
punch and bowls of fruit were 
on tables all day.

After lunch drawings were 
held. Mranida Owens of 
White Oak, Texas, won the 
quilt. She is great-great- 
granddaughter of Alma and 
Fred. A fish pond was held for 
youngsters and 88 and visit­
ing for the oldsters.

Those present from out-of- 
town were: Ms. Katherine

Patterson and Chris from  
Shallow Water, Texas; Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Spieker from Mineral 
Wells; Mr. and Mrs. Kim Hook­
er from San Saba; Mr. and 
Mrs. Wes Hooker from Junc­
tion, Texas; Mr. and Mrs. Pe­
ter Delamater and sons from 
Kansas; Mr. and Mrs. Raymon 
Owens from White Oak, 
Texas; Mr. and Mrs. F. W. 
Spieker from Ballinger, Texas; 
Mr. and Mrs. Wes Oats and 
daughter, from San Antonio, 
Texas; and Shari Patterson 
from Shallow Water, Texas. 
Those attending from San 
Angelo included: Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Oats; Mr. and Mrs. 
Calvin Wanoreck and boys; 
Mr. and Mrs. James Kahiig; Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Vick; Mr. and 
Mrs. Herbert Fuessel; Mr. and 
Mrs. Terry Fuessel and child; 
Anna Spieker; Judy Cmerck 
and daughter; Susan Fisher 
and son; Anna R. Proctor; 
Janet Ziechike; Helen Spiek­
er; Sharon L. Warmon and 
children; Mr. and Mrs. West­
brook; and many visitors.

When It was time to depart 
everyone agreed that 1993 
was one of the best reunions 
of all and felt like they had 
certainly made a trip to Hawaii.

Shannon
HEALTH NOTES
AGONY OF DA FEET

Nine out of ten people who come to see orthopedic surgeons 
at Northwestern Memorial Hospital in Chicago are women. Dr. 
Armen Kelikian said that fits with recent estimates that three out 
of four women have foot pain, and studies showing that a similar 
percentage of women between ages of twenty and sixty were wear­
ing the wrong size shoe - too small or too narrow.

He says many women with larger feet try to squeeze into 
smaller shoes to make their feet look smaller. Dr. Kelikian offers 
tips to minimize foot problems. Always have your foot measured 
when you buy a new pair of shoes. Feet get larger as you get older. 
Don't buy shoes that you hope will stretch. Shoes should feel com­
fortable when you buy them. Shop for shoes at the end of the day 
when your feet are largest.

©1992, Lyle Dean. Inc.
Shannon Health Notes is a public service ofShannon Medical Center

n o  East Harris • San Angelo. Texas • i915i 633-6741. Ext. 347

FOOD

STAMPS

WELCOME

LIM IT

RIGHTS

RESERVED

501 Commerce - Robert Lee. TX
Store H rsr M 8-8 Sun,. , 876

SPECIALS GOOD 6/23 THRU 6/29

IGA Tablerite

Franks
Country Style

Pork Ribs
Lb. 1.39

Juicy

Nectarines 

6/$1  -

R usse t

Llbby*$

Tomatoes
16 oz.

10 Lb, 
Bag

B i i
1 8  C t  

otn.

Potatoes

.99
IGA Large

Eggs

.89
Coke, 7-Up,

Barqs, Sunkist 
Orange,
Fresca,
Mr. Pibb

1.398 pk,
12 OZ. cans



Page 4 Friday, June 25, 1993 The Observer/Enterprise

OES installs new officers

Tamara Richards

Richards
graduates

Tamara Richards, daughter of 
Sondra Elam and great- 
grandaughter of Josie Sims, 
graduated from Jersey Village 
High School in Houston. 
Tamara graduated with 
scholastic honor and will at­
tend Sam Houston State Uni­
versity this fall.

Kelly Freeman, Tamara's 
sister, graduated from Camp­
bell Junior High and was 
awarded the President's 
Board for highest scholastic 
achievement.

Tamara and Kelly are former 
students of the Bronte 
schools.

Spence Fishin' 
W ater Temp - 79 

Paint Creek Marina
Ronnie Brown, from Odessa, 
TX, hooked 5 black bass up to 
a total of 10 1/2 lbs.
Cade Skinner, from Portales, 
N. M. hooked a 15 1/2 lb. 
striper and a 12 lb. bluecat on 
cut shad.
Tom and Jimmv Tidwell, from 
San Angelo, TX, hooked a 21 
lb. yellowcat on trotline.

W ildca t Marina 
Trevor Pierce and family, from 
San Angelo, TX, and Jack 
Raymond and fa m ily , of 
Kingsland, TX, hooked 4 
stripers up to 4 1/2 lbs. on cut 
shad.
Tino Tanauma. from San An­
gelo, TX, hooked a 15 1/2 lb. 
striper on artifical lure.
Randy Chambers, f r om 
Odessa, TX, hooked 2 
stripers at 10 3/4 lbs. on live 
shiners.
Jerry Green, from Big Spring, 
TX, hooked 15 s tr ip e rs , 
largest at 16 3/4 lbs. on live 
shad.
Randy and Terri Durosette. 
from Odessa, TX, hooked 
three stripers at 11 lbs. 2 oz. 
total, and 2 channel cat up to 
4 lbs.
Larry Ward, from Odessa, TX, 
limited on stripers in two days 
from 7 lbs. up to 9 lbs. on live 
shiners.
Wavne Duzan. hooked 2 0 
channel cats up to 6 1/2 lbs 
on trotline with cut shad.
Darrell Sorev. from Green­
wood, TX, hooked a 13 1/4 lb. 
striper.

G erm a n ia  In su ra n ce

C overing Texas 
since 1896. 
Property, liability 
and life insurance

«
^ 7

Bill Carwile 
4 5 3 - 2 5 2 2

Robert Lee Chapter No. 
187 Order of the Eastern Star 
held their Installation of Offi­
cers, Saturday, June 12, 
1993, in the Hayrick Masonic 
Lodge building in Robert Lee.

Ruth Robertson was in­
stalled as Worthy Matron and 
Donald Robertston as Worthy 
Patron for 1993-1994. Other 
officers for the year are: Lou 
Wright - Associate Matron; 
Bob Large - Associate Patron; 
Nancy Allen - Secretary; Reba 
Tabor - Treasurer; Dorothea 
Helen Wright - Conductress; 
Jeffie Roberts - Associate 
Conductress; Tammy Roe - 
Chaplain; John Jacobs - Mar­
shal; Mary Beth Drennan - Or­
ganist; JoAnn Harrison - 
Adah; Dovie Cummins - Ruth; 
Dolores Roe - Esther; Christ! 
Bagwell - Martha; Lillian Mid­
dleton - Electra; O. B. Jacobs - 
Warder; Bobby Roberts - 
Sentinel.

The Installation began at 
7:00 with a piano prelude by 
Mary Belle Hilliard. The Bible 
was presented by T e rr i 
Robertson and the Square 
and Compasses were pre­
sented by Scott Robertson, 
the son and daughter-in-law 
of the Worthy Matron and 
Worthy Patron. Bob Large, 
outgoing Worthy Patron, 
called the meeting to order. 
The outgoing officers en­
tered, the Bible was opened, 
the Lord's Prayer repeated in 
unison. Pledge of Allegiance 
to the Flag repeated, the Na­
tional Anthem was sung, and 
Polly Large, the outgoing 
Worthy Matron, gave the wel­
come and introduction.

Serving as installing officers 
were Becky Camp of Carlsbad 
Chapter - Installing Officer; 
Nancy Allen of Robert Lee - 
Installing Marshal; Dolores 
Roe of Robert Lee - Assisting 
Installing Marshal; Shirley 
Thomas of San Angelo - Sec­
retary Pro-Tern; Mary Belle 
Hilliard of Bronte - Installing 
Organist; and Ettie Hubbard 
of Bronte - Installing Chaplin.

The officers were installed, 
the Bible closed, "Doxology" 
sung. The Mizapah Benedic­
tion repeated in unison, 
greetings were given by Ruth 
and Donald Robertson newly 
installed Worthy Matron and 
Patron, special courtesies 
extended and the Benedic­
tion was given. A delicious 
salad supper was prepared 
and served by members of 
Robert Lee Chapter to the 
approximately 50 present.

Ruth dedicated her year to 
all members both past and 
present of the Order of the 
Eastern Star with special em­

phasis given to her grandpar­
ents, the late Thelma and Jeff 
Blair, whose inspiration for the 
Order, prompted her to be­
come a member.

She chose as her motto - 
"Friendship and Peace"; Em­
blem - the open Bible; Colors - 
All colors especially blue and 
white; Flower - all spring flow­
ers especially the Easter Lily.

Robert Lee Chapter No. 
187 meets the 2nd Thursday 
of each month at 7:30 pm. All 
members are invited to at­
tend.

M issionary
in Russia

The Northside Church of 
Christ in Robert Lee has cho­
sen to join other area congre­
gations in sponsorship and 
support of Grady Bryan who 
will work with others in Russia. 
A native of Norton and the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Sealy 
Bryan, he left with a mission­
ary group on June 16 for the 
Ukraine, a Soviet republic in 
southwest Russia. The group 
traveled by plane via Dallas, 
Houston, Amsterdam and 
Kiev. Travel in the Russian 
interior will be by train.

The mission field is fairly 
new, at least in a free, open 
manner, to the country. Other 
church workers in the area 
have found the people eager 
for Christianity and zealous in 
study and attendance to ser­
vices.

Those who have been to 
Russia on such missions re­
port the people are warm and 
friendly but with incredible 
hardships. Food is scarce and 
living conditions hard with 
widespread poverty. They 
also report tremendous satis­
faction in the work since the 
people are anxious to hear 
their message and are so ea­
ger to accept religion.

Several of the missionary 
group have spouses who will 
accompany them. However, 
Grady Bryan is a single young 
man and has committed him­
self to a two-year stint in the 
Ukraine.

Eubanks to 
attend M unicipal

Fire School
Keith Eubanks, member of 

the Robert Lee Volunteer Fire 
Department, will attend the 
Municipal Fire School portion 
of the 1993 Texas Firemen's 
Training School. The school 
is to be held at Texas A & M 
July 25-30. He will be spon­
sored by the Coke-Sterling 
Farm Bureau.

^ \ i n t r y  P e d d l e ^
'O

ODESSA, TX
FRL, SAT., & SUN. - JUNE 25, 26 & 27,19931

Ector County .Fairgrounds • 42nd & Andrews Hwy
HOURS: FRI., 4 - 9  pm* SAT., 9 am - 6 pm» SUN., 11 am - 5 pm 

^ADMISSION: Adults $4 • Children Under 12 Free • Seniors over 65 $2 
Folk Art and Country Crafts

Furniture, metalwork, guilts, baskets, rugs, dried flowers, clothing, Santas, 
teddy bears, pottery, dolls...everything quality, original and handcrafted. 

American Country Shows, Inc. • Country Peddler Show^w/.^^ 
P.O. Box 706 • Port Aransas. Texas 78373 • (512) 749-5449

Carl and Leveta Bloodworth of Sundown an­
nounce the engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter, Amy Jo, to Doug 
Barnes, son of Royce and Connie Barnes of 
Lazbuddie.

The couple wiil marry August 21 at 3 pm in 
the First Baptist Church in Sundown.

The bride-elect is a graduate of Sundown 
High School and South Piains College with a 
degree for Medical Secretary. Her grandpar­
ents are Raymond and Gertie Bioodworth of 
Siiver. She is employed by B. A. R. Treating 
Service as a secretary.

The future bridegroom is a graduate of 
Lazbuddie High Schooi and South Piains 
Coiiege. His grandparents are Lucille Barnes 
of Farwell and Rosalene Julian of Georgetown. 
He is a farmer in Lazbuddie.

Are you shoveling too much 
money into your car?

©  P.I.E.
If auto repair expense is adding up to more than 

your car is worth, stop in and see us. We may be 
able to help you trade in that old ‘clunker’ for a 
new car.

You’ll find our interest rates attractive and our 
service fast and friendly. Isn’t it about time you 
quit shoveling money into that old car?

See us today.

lE l
EQUAL HOUSING
LENDER

Robert Lee 
State Bank

M em ber FDIC J
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Club playday results told
May 14, 1993 

5 & Under w/help
Barrels

1st. Nicole Reed, 1:20.15 
2nd. Kasie Skinner, 1:32.98 
3rd. Ashley Royall, 1:48.88 
4th. C. T. Loyd, 1:54.55.

Flags
1st. C. T. Loyd, 1:00.49; 

2nd. Kasie Skinner, 1:36.90. 
EqIqs

1st. Nicole Reed, 1:20.43; 
2nd. Kasie Skinner, 1:37.16; 
3rd. C. T. Loyd, 1:51.46; 4th. 
Ashley Royall, 2:46.18.

Goat Hair Pulling 
1st. C. T. Loyd, 41.66; 2nd. 

Kasie Skinner, 49.56.
5 & Under 

Barrels
1st. Brandi Lee, 19.45; 

2nd. Lillian McMullan, 39.44; 
3rd. Becca Skinner, 1:12.68.

.Flags
1st. Brandi Lee, 30.87; 

2nd. Lillian McMullan, 41.00; 
3rd. Becca Skinner, 58.84. 

Poles
1st. Brandi Lee, 25.27; 

2nd. Lillian McMullan, 41.83; 
3rd. Becca Skinner, 1:11.99. 

Goat Hair Pulling 
1st. Lillian McMullan, 17.60; 

2nd. Brandi Lee, 19.64; 3rd. 
Becca Skinner, 28.09.

6 to 7 Year Olds 
Barrels

1st. Natalee Reed, 21.09 
2nd. Heather Pfiuger, 30.56 
3rd. Lyndon Butler, 33.63 
4th. Amber Brosh, 30.85. 

Flags
1st. Heather Pfiuger, 10.25 

2nd. Natalee Reed, 12.48 
3rd. Lyndon Butler, 17.45 
4th. Amber Brosh, 1:15.64. 

Poles
1st. Natalee Reed, 26.56 

2nd. Heather Pfiuger, 28.69 
3rd. Ashley Denton, 36.59 
4th. Amber Brosh, 40.32; 5th. 
Lyndon Butler, 43.92.

Goat Hair Pulling 
1st. Heather Pfiuger, 14.38; 

2nd. Ashley Denton, 16.84; 
3rd. Amber Brosh, 19.71; 4th. 
Natalee Reed, 20.13.

8 to 9 Year Olds 
Barrels

1st. Natasha Reed, 19.95.
Flags

1st. Natasha Reed, 14.78. 
PqIss

1st. Natasha Reed, No 
Time.

Goat Tying
1st. Natash Reed, 26.33.
10 to 12 Year Olds

Barrels
1st. Tessie McMullan, 

18.45; 2nd. Brittany Barret, 
19.96; 3rd. Valine Butler, 
22.75; 4th. Mandy Pfiuger, 
23.22; 5th. Brandy Denton,

26.04.
Bags

1st. Tessie McMullan, 9.57; 
2nd. Brittany Barrett, 9.94; 
3rd. Mandy Pfiuger, 10.63; 
4th. Valine Butler, 13.78; 5th. 
Brandy Denton, 14.52.

Poles
1st. Tessie McMullan, 

20.70; 2nd. Brittany Barrett, 
24.24; 3rd. Brandy Denton, 
24.84; 4th. Mandy Pfiuger, 
26.05; 5th. Valine Butler, 
32.10.

Goat Tying
1st. Tessie McMullan, 

12.24; 2nd. Brandy Denton, 
13.33; 3rd. Mandy Pfiuger, 
17.45; 4th. Brittany Barrett, 
21.27.

13 to 15 Year Olds
B.aLrels

1st. Dusty Arrott, 19.44; 2nd. 
Courtney Arrott, 20.56; 3rd. 
Leia Brunson, 23.37; 4th. 
Brandi Brosh, 27.11.

Bags
1st. Courtney Arrott, 9.63; 

2nd. Dusty Arrott, 10.41; 3rd. 
Leia Brunson, 10.52; 4th. 
Brandi Brosh, 11.50.

Poles
1st. Courtney Arrott, 24.11; 

2nd. Brandi Brosh, 24.51; 
3rd. Leia Brunson, 30.94; 
4th. Dusty Arrott, 31.43.

Goat Tying
1st. Dusty Arrott, 18?01; 

2nd. Brandi Brosh, 35.18.
Coke County 

Playday Results 
May 28, 1993

5 & Under w /help
Barrels

1st. Kasie Skinner, 1:28.13; 
2nd.Lindsey Butler, 1;38.81; 
3rd. Ashley Royall, 1:50.64. 

Flags
1st. Lindsey Butler, 51.39; 

2nd. Ashley Royall, 1:05.46; 
3rd. Kasie Skinner, 1:13.42. 

£.oJ.e§
1st. Kasie Skinner, 1:11.21; 

2nd. Lindsey Butler, 1:42.95. 
Goat Hair Pulling 

1st. Kasie Skinner, 35.53; 
2nd. Ashley Royall, 51.56.

5 & Under 
Barrels

1st. Becca Skinner,
1:01.83.

Bags
1st. Becca Skinner, 30.13.

Eoies
1st. Becca Skinner,

1:16.01.
Goat Hair Pulling 

1st. Becca Skinner, 29.21.
6 to 7 Year Olds

Barrels
1st. Heather Pluger, 19.91; 

2nd. Charles Pfiuger, 26.79;

VanZandt, Lehman marry in Las Vegas

(cont'd. on page 7)

/ — GLENN-BIVINS INSURANCE
( yovR . Mnaepenofnf
yJflU/fülHfg A CCN T  , Come See Us For

AUTO HOUSE LIFE HEALTH
123 W. Main Bronte 473-6791

GENERAL 
CARPENTRY 

REMODELING 
WORK

K it c h e n s T  Baths
Benny Owen & O H H S B
Robert Lee F A C T O T X

(915) 453-2192 ■flik H

Lesa Kay VanZandt and 
Louis D. Lohman both of Gar­
land, Texas, were married on 
Tuesday, May 18, at the  
Graceland Wedding Chapel in 
Las Vegas, Nevada.

The bride is the daughter of 
Donna VanZandt of Pea 
Ridge, Arkansas and Edgar 
VanZandt of Seligman, Mis­
souri. She is currently em­
ployed as a manager with 
Lane Bryant of Dallas, Texas.

The groom is the son of Lee 
and Dot Starling of Robert 
Lee, Texas. He is currently 
employed as a manager with 
Calloway's Nurseries of Dallas, 
Texas.

Following the honeymoon, 
the couple is at home in Gar­
land.

RL Golf Results
Results for the Parent/Child 

Golf Tournament held at 
Mountain Creek Golf Course 
Saturday, June 19 have been 
released. They are as follows: 

First Fiight
1st with a 64 - Daisy and 
Quinn Conley
2nd with a 65 - Joseph and Ed | 
Coranado
3rd with a 65 - Jarrod and 
Tommy Morrison

Second Flight 
1st with a 72 - Chad Duncan 
and Randy Crooks 
2nd with a 72 - Lance and 
Janie Trowbridge 
3rd with a 73 - Curt and Davis 
Corley

Third Flight
1st with a 76 - Tim and Bill 
Lupardis
2nd with a 78 - Sean and Ray 
Hernandez
3rd with a 83 - Melissa and 
Tony Smith

Personal
Sheila (Roberts) Farrar, 

Crystal and Lauren recently 
visited in the home of their 
parents and grandparents, 
Bobby and Jeffie Roberts of 
Robert Lee. Crystal and Lau­
ren remained in Robert Lee 
with their grandparents for a 
two week visit.

PUBLIC NOTICE
Texas Utilities Electric Company 
(“TU Electric”) hereby publishes 
notice that, pursuant to Public  
U tility  C om m ission  o f Texas 
Substantive Rule 23.21 (c) (2) (E), 
it filed an application on April 21, 
1993, with the Public U tility  
Commission o f Texas in Docket 
No. 11972 to show com m ercial 
operation date for Comanche Peak 
Steam Electric Station Unit 2. A 
complete copy of said application is 
on file  with the Public U tility  
Commission of Texas.

Persons with questions about this 
proceeding should contact Richard 
W istrand at (214 ) 8 1 2 -4679 . 
Persons who wish to intervene in 
the proceeding or comment upon 
action sought, should contact the 
Public U tility  C om m ission  o f  
T exas, at 7800  Shoal Creek 
Boulevard, Austin, Texas 78757, or 
call'the Public Utility Commission 
Public Information Office at (512) 
458-0256, or (512) 458-0221 for 
the telecommunications device for 
the deaf within 30 days o f  this 
notice.

nWELECTRIC

Mr. and Mrs. Louis D. Lohman.

Davis Grocery & Meat
North Hwy 208 - Robert Lee - 453-2488

Asst. Kinds

Ruffles Reg.
2 .8 9

12 pk. cans
Classic-Diet

Coke
Hot Dog - 
H am burger Buns
Better Valu

Facial Tissue
George Jones Country Gold

D o g  F o o d  20 Lb Bag ^

1.99

2 .79

.29

.49

Asst. Kinds Mix or Match

Patty Cake Cookies2/.9  9
E ckrich

German Sausage 1.29

*49
P ayton

W i e n e r s
"Thick Slice"

Slab Bacon
Cut to Order

Sirloin Steak

Lb. 1.29
Lb.

"Fresh"

Ground Meat
Market Cut Sandwich Meat

Chopped Ham
WATCH FOR OUR IN STORE SPECIALS!

Lb.

Lb.

2 .49

1.39
.99

Specials good 6-24-93 thru 6-30-93 
___  Food Stamps Welcome

WE HAVE BAR-B-QUE I 
BEANS - POTATO SALAD
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BUY
SELL

IT.
IT.

FIN D  IT.

CLASSI F I ED
CLASSIFIED  

ADVERTISING RATES

1st. Insertion...
20c Per Word 

($3.00 Minimum) 
2nd. and Subsequent 
Insertions...

16c Per Word 
($2.50 Minimum)

Additional 50c 
for Blind Ads 

Cards/Thanks...
20c Per Word 

Legal Notices...
20c Per Word

COPY DEADLINE
Class Ads..5 pm Tues. 

Display Ads..5 pm Tues. 
Classified Ads & Cards of 

Thanks are payable in 
ADVANCE unless customer 
carries regular account.

C FOR SALE j
DICK’S FIREWOOD -
Fireplace wood, campfire
wood, and BBQ wood. 453- 
2151, Robert Lee.
_____________ 41-tPg

TENNYSON ROAD
brick, 3 bedroom, 11/2 bath,
2 living areas on 2 acres plus. 
$33,000 FHA or VA. Cave 
Real Estate (915) 949-8583. 
 41 B-tnc

FOR SALE
3 Bedroom, 2 Baths, game 
room, 2200 sq. ft., 
$50,000.00. Sparks or Bev­
erly Burdett, 453-2887. 
 33-tnc

SHRFFER 
FUNERRL HOME
BRONTE ROBERT LEE

473-3131 453-2424
MONUMENTS
Duplications 

Custom Designs

Elaine Lee 
4 5 3 - 2 9 9 5

Laura E. Crenshaw 
4 5 3 - 2 7 6 1

t i iEQlUAL HOUSINGopportunity

MEADOWVIEW
ESTATES

14 X 70 mobile home, shed, 
fenced, carport. New to mar­
ket

ROBERT LEE
3 Bedroom, 2 baths, home. 
Corner lot, fenced backyard. 
Hillcrest addition. $38,000

ADAMS LAND & 
REALTY CO.

Phone 453-2723 or 
655-9429

Elsie Adams 453-2757

MOVING
For sale - 1972 Plymouth Fury 
III station wagon, $400.00. 
Also new utility trailer, 4'x8‘, 
$200.00; studio couch, $25; 
and new ceramic dishes, ser­
vice for 12, $25. 509 W. 15th 
St., Robert Lee. 453-2133 
_____________46-1tc

FOR SALE
17,500 BTU air conditioner 
(window unit). $150.00 or 
OBO. Call 453-4745 after 
6:00 pm.
_____________ 43-tnc

HOUSE FOR SALE 
BY OWNER

4 Bedroom, 2 bath, CH/CA 
home on corner lot. Large 
pecan trees, fireplace. 223 
Key St. Call 473-4201 after 6 
pm.
_____________37B-tnc

FOR SALE BY OWNER
3 bedroom, 2 bath, CH/CA on 
2 acres. Fenced yard and 
above ground pool. Assum­
able loan. 706 Meadow Lane 
in Bronte. Ken Peel, 473- 
2164. Asking $50,000. 
_____________45B-tnc

FOR SALE
Mobile Home - 2 bedroom, 2 
bath. Excellent condition. 
Must see to appreciate. 465- 
4710
_____ _______ 44-4tc

BY OWNER
Owner moved - priced right for 
sale, other interest, in Robert 
Lee, 11 Lots, 50x100 with 
14x70 mobile home. Two 
lots, mobile home hook-ups, 
garage 12x30, boat storage 
24x20. Good area for horses, 
etc. Serious inquiries, 915- 
345-2986.
_____________ 46-tnc

Sunshine Gardens §

Open Wed. - Sat. 9-6 - Sun. 1-4 
Moved to Old Hillside Building 

2 Miles West of Robert Lee on Hwy. 158
Ii

^  SUPER SRLE ERIOHŸ f> SRTURDRV ^

FOR SALE

3 BR HOUSE, 2 BA, central 
heat & air, numerous extras, 
well-kept, large corner lot, 
trees, sprinkler system, 
garage, patio, and storage 
buildings.
2 BR, 1 BA house Bayview 
Estates
Mobile Home on 4 lots in 
Robert Lee.
2 1/2 CORNER LOTS
facing Hwy 208
3 LOTS on east side Hwy. 
158

2 STORY 3 BR, 2 BA on 2 
corner lots with sprinkler sys­
tem. Price reduced to upper 
20’s.

3 BR, 2 BATH,
central heat and air, 13.31 
acres, 2 wells, pens, carport, 
storage sheds. Maverick 
community, near Bronte. 1- 
800-382-5168 or 915-786- 
2060.
_____________46B-2tc

HERITAGE 
LIVE OAK TREES

All sizes, ranging from 7 gal­
lon-40 gallon containers. Also 
multi-trunks. Guaranteed best 
price you'll find. Large selec­
tion to choose from. PBS 
Nursery, Ballinger, TX. Nurs­
ery - 365-3269 or nights, 
Donnie Bruton, 365-2372.
... ...................... 30-tnc

GARAGE SALE
Furniture, clothes, kitchen ar­
ticles, desks, and office sup­
plies, tools, old typewriter, 
many mise, items. Please do 
not come before 8 am Satur­
day. Jerry Horn, 1006 W. 
11th, Robert Lee.
___ _̂________46-1tP

GARAGE SALE
302 W. 15th, Robert Lee. 
Saturday, June 26, 7:30 am to 
1:00 pm.
_____________46-1tP

GARAGE SALE
301 Key, Bronte. Friday, Sat­
urday, and Sunday. 
_____________4.6B:1tp

TREE SPRAYING
Pecan, Mulberry, and Etc. 
Also spray yards for fleas and 
ticks. PBS Nursery, 365- 
3269 - nights Donnie Bruton, 
365-2372, Ballinger, Texas. 
____________ 44-8tc

COMPUTER OPERA­
TORS

Earn up to $100 per day plus. 
Work without pressure using 
your computer skills. Call 1- 
800-695-2810. 
_____________45B-16tC

IMMEDIATE OPENINGS
Trimming photographs, with­
out prior experience, up to 
$300.00/wk. Call now - 1- 
800-685-9303. 
_____________45-16tc
fm

^  CONCHO REALTY ^
1886 Pecos, Suite 4 

San Angelo, TX 76901 
Office: (915) 653-4535

or 1-800-530-4242
Becky Clendennen - (Home) 

453-4748

B Q9ERT LEE
3 BEDROOM,

2 1/2 bath brick home 
54+ ACRES

3 bedroom, 2 bath home

3 BEDROOM,
2 bath home 

4 ACRES WITH
4 bedroom, 3 bath home

BRONTE
COUNTRY LIVING

3 bedroom, 2 bath on 10+ 
acres

3 BEDROOM,
2 bath brick home on 1 1/2 

lots

FARMS & RANCHES
350+ ACRES

between Robert Lee and
Bronte

318+ ACRES
north of Robert Lee 
150+ ACRES
north of Bronte

115 ACRES
between Bronte and Ballinger

130 ACRES
at Orient with brick home

C MiSC D
DAVID’S BARBER SHOP
will be closed Saturday, the 
26th.
_____________46-1tp

Johnson*s 
Water Well

S e rv ic e
Farm

Ranch Home 
Windmills & Pumps 

24 HR. SERVICE
6 5 8 -6 0 3 9

or
6 5 5 - 0 3 7 9

APPLIANCE REPAIRS
Refrtgerators, washers, 
dryers, freezers, window 
units. Have references. 

4 5 3 - 2 1 8 8

FOR SALE
3 Bedroom house with 3+ 
acres. 408 East Main Street, 
Bronte. Town out the front, 
country out the back. A ll 
electric plus efficient wood 
burning heater. Good fences. 
$33,500, owner - 473-3751. 
_____________44B-tnc

C FOR RENT }
Small 2 bedroom house, un­
furnished, fenced yard in 
Bronte. Available July 1. For 
information call 473-4643 
from 5:00-9:00 pm. or 655- 
9549 in San Angejo anytime. 
_____________47B-tnc

DO YOU HAVE
a drinking problem? Call Al­
coholics Anonymous, 453- 
2158, 453-2100, or 453- 
4382. Meetings - Friday, 8 
pm; Sunday, 5 pm; Coke 
County Courthouse, Robert 
Lee.
_____________46-tnc

WILL DO ODD JOBS
mowing, etc. Contact Michael 
at 453-2887.
_____________43:lnc

D&L DOZER SERVICE
Larry Spivey, Owner-Opera­
tor. PO Box 160, Bronte, TX. 
Phone (Oak Creek Lake) 915- 
743-2577.
_____________21 B-tnc

WANTED
Deer lease for 4-6 hunters 
who will take care of land and 
livestock. 915-648-3828.
— ___________ 44-4tc

ROBINSON AUTOMO­
TIVE

Specializing in major over­
hauls, guaranteed for 6 month 
or 6,000 miles. 310 W. 16th, 
Robert Lee, 453-2266. 
_________ 45-4tP

NATIONAL 
PUBLISHING FIRM

needs people to label post­
cards from home. $800/wk. 
Set your own hours. Call 1- 
900-740-7377 ($1.49 min/18 
yrs+) or write; PAASE-H132, 
161 S. Lincolnway, N. Aurora, 
IL 60542
_____________46-4tp

TYPIST
High potential earnings. Will­
ing to train. Call 1-800-964- 
3261.
_____________4S.B-jl,.6tg.

I WILL TRADE WORK
Painting, roofing, a n d  
carpentry for money, car, or 
pickup. Raymond McGuire, 
453-2354.
_____________43-4tp

C NOTICES j
NOTICE TO ALL PER­
SONS HAVING CLAIMS 
AGAINST THE ESTATE 
OF ROY GALVAN, DE­
CEASED

Administration of the Estate 
of Roy Galvan, Deceased, has 
been commenced by the is­
suance of original Letters of 
Administration to Micaela Gal­
van on May 3, 1993, by the 
County Court of Coke Coun­
ty, Texas, acting in Cause No. 
1428, styled In Re: Estate of 
Roy Galvan, Deceased, in 
which court the matter Is 
pending.

All persons having claims 
against the estate are hereby 
notified to present them to 
the undersigned at the ad­
dress shown below within the 
time prescribed by law.
DATED this 22nd day of 
June, 1993.

Chris A. Wyatt 
PO Drawer 529 

Robert Lee, TX 76945 
Attorney for Micaela Galvan 

Administrator of the Estate of 
Roy Galvan, Deceased 

_____________46a-1tc

PUBLIC NOTICE
The Commissioner's Court of 
Coke County will hold a Public 
Hearing on Tuesday, July 6, 
1993 at 8:30 am in the Com­
missioner's Courtroom of the 
Coke County Courthouse to

CGARAGE SALES J
r NOW OPEN FOR BUSINESS

GARAGE SALE
1201 Childress, Robert Lee, 
June 26 & 27, 8 am - ? 
Weather permitting. Lots of 
mise, items.
_____________46-1tP

LONE STAR MAINTENANCE 
Air Conditioning - Heating 
Commercial Refrigeration 

TACL B 012289 C 
4 7 3 -2 0 4 0  Danny

B r o n t e  O w n e r
T h o m as
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c NOTICES j
discuss adoption of an Order 
establishing uniform stan­
dards for naming roads and 
assigning address numbers to 
p rope rty  loca ted  in
unincorporated areas of the 
county.
_____________ 45a-2tg

WEST COKE COUNTY 
HOSPITAL DISTRICT

will accept sealed bids from 
Licensed plumbers until July 
15, 1993 for revamping of the 
gas system at the nursing 
home.

Contact the administrator at 
915-453-2511 for informa-

____________45a-2tc

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
The City of Robert Lee is ac­
cepting bids on a good, used 
pickup, 1991 or later, low 
mileage, comparable to a 
1991 Ford Ranger Supercab. 
4 or 6 cylinder 
6 speed 
Air
Warranty required 
Bids can be delivered to City 
Hall, 6 E. 7th St., In Robert 
Lee or mailed to City of Robert

THE STATE OF TEXAS

TO; MARTIN LUTHER MOORE, ALMA MOORE, R. L. MOORE, MILES L. 
MOORE,JAMES WALTER MOORE, DANA LOUISE MOORE, LETHA BAKER 
SHOLARS, LUCILLE BAKER MCCREARY, LOLA BAKER COBB, LENA BAKER 
HULEN, VIOLA BAKER PAGE, LYNA BAKER HYSMITH, HATTIE EUGENIA 
BAKER AMONETTE, KATHERINE AMONETTE CUTTER, LELA AMONETTE 
OLIVER, AND GEORGE BASCOM ROBERTS, ODELL O.ALFRED, GEORGE 
BASCOM ROBERTS AS TRUSTEE FOR JOY BETH ROBERTS HARGUS, JOY 
BETH ROBERTS HARGUS, PEGGY CARSWELL, FRANK JOHNSON, KAY 
JOHNSON DAIL, DR. L. F. JOHNSON AS TRUSTEE FOR LEE BRYANT DAIL, LEE 
BRYANT DAIL, DR. L. F.JOHNSON AS TRUSTEE FOR THE CHILDREN OF 
FRANK JOHNSON, DONALD JOHNSON, THE UNKNOWN CHILDREN OF FRANK 
JOHNSON, FRANCES HUNTER MORRISON, HAROLD D. YOUNG, AND ED E. 
KING, AND EACH OF THEIR UNKNOWN SURVIVING SPOUSES AND 
UNKNOWN HEIRS, IF ANY SUCH BE DECEASED.

NOTICE: "You have been sued. You may employ an attorney. If you or your attorney 
do not file a written answer with the clerk who issued this citation by 10:00 a.m. on the 
Monday next following the expiration of forty-two days from the date of issuance of this 
citation, same being August 3, 1993 a default judgment may be taken against you."

You, and each of you, are hereby commanded to appear and answer before the 51st 
Judicial District Court of Coke County, Texas, in the Coke County Courthouse, Robert Lee, 
Coke County, Texas, at or before 10:00 a.m. on the first Monday next after expiration of 
42 days from the date of issuance of this citation, same being the 9th day of August, 1993, 
then and there to answer the petition of GEORGE H. JAMES and wife, EARLENE 
JAMES, plaintiffs, in Cause Number 3592, styled "GEORGE H. JAMES, JR. AND WIFE, 
EARLENE JAMES VS. MARTIN LUTHER MOORE, ALMA MOORE, R. L.MOORE, 
MILES L. MOORE,JAMES WALTER MOORE, DANA LOUISE MOORE, LETHA 
BAKER SHOLARS, LUCILLE BAKER MCCREARY, LOLA BAKER COBB, LENA 
BAKER HULEN, VIOLA BAKER PAGE, LYNA BAKER HYSMITH, HATTIE 
EUGENIA BAKER AMONETTE, KATHERINE AMONETTE CUTTER, LELA 
AMONETTE OLIVER, AND GEORGE BASCOM ROBERTS, ODELL O.ALFRED, 
GEORGE BASCOM ROBERTS AS TRUSTEE FOR JOY BETH ROBERTS HARGUS, 
JOY BETH ROBERTS HARGUS, PEGGY CARSWELL, FRANK JOHNSON, KAY 
JOHNSON DAIL, DR. L. F. JOHNSON AS TRUSTEE FOR LEE BRYANT DAIL, LEE 
BRYANT DAIL, DR. L. F.JOHNSON AS TRUSTEE FOR THE CHILDREN OF 
FRANK JOHNSON, DONALD JOHNSON, THE UNKNOWN CHILDREN OF FRANK 
JOHNSON, FRANCES HUNTER MORRISON, HAROLD D. YOUNG, AND ED E. 
KING, AND EACH OF THEIR UNKNOWN SURVIVING SPOUSES AND 
UNKNOWN HEIRS, IF ANY SUCH BE DECEASED." Plaintiffs’ petition was filed in 
said court by CHRIS A. WYATT, attorney for plaintiff, whose address is P.O. Box 529, 
Robert Lee, Texas, 76945, on the 17th day of June, 1993.

This suit is brought as a trespass to try title action to recover all right, title, and 
interest owned and claimed by said defendants in the following described lands.

Being 50 acres of land out of the west central part of Survey No. 17, A.B. «&
M. Survey No. 17, Abstract No. 12, which survey was patented to John T. 
Slaughter, Assignee, by the State of Texas, by Patent No. 138, Volume 26, 
dated October 6, 1876, under and by virtue of Certificate No. 320, and 
described by metes and bounds as follows, to wit:

BEGINNING at a stone mound marked "X" set in ground on East line of 
Bronte and San Angelo road 629-1/4 vrs. South and 36 feet East of NW 
corner of Survey 17, A. B. & M;
THENCE East 1066 vrs. to rock marked "X" set in ground for the NE comer 
of this 50-acre tract and SE corner of G. H. James, Jr., 120 acre tract;
THENCE South 264-1/4 vrs. to stone marked "X" and set in ground for SE 
corner of this 50-acre tract;
THENCE West 1066 vrs. to stone marked "X" and set in ground for SW 
corner of this 50-acre tract;
THENCE North 264-1/4 vrs. to place of beginning (hereinafter referred-to as 
the "Property").

This suit is brought as a trespass to try title action pursuant to Tex. Rules Civ. Proc. 
§783, in order to establish Plaintiffs’ title in fee simple to the Property, by both recorded 
deed to Plaintiffs’ and by adverse possession of the Property, as indicated by Plaintiffs’ 
Original Petition on file in this cause, which more fully shows the nature of this suit.

If citation is not served within 90 days after the date of issuance, it shall be returned 
unserved.

The officer executing this writ shall promptly serve the same according to the 
requirements of law and the mandates hereof, and make due return as the law directs.

ISSUED AND GIVEN UNDER MY FIAND AND SEAL OF SAID COURT at 
Coke County, Texas, this 22nd day of June, 1993.

Clerk of the District Court, 
Coke County, Texas

P. O. Box 150 
Robert Lee, Texas 76945

Lee, PO Box 26, Robert Lee, 
Texas, 76945. Bids must be 
received before 5 pm, Friday, 
June 25, 1993.
The City reserves the right to 
reject any and all bids. 
_____________45a-2tc

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
Notice is hereby given that 
the City of Bronte will receive 
bids for a 1993 or 1994 New 
or Demonstrator pickup. Bids 
will be received at the City Hall 
uniti 5:00 pm, July 8, 1993. 
Specifications for the pickup 
can be obtained at the City 
Hall or by calling 473-3501.

The City of Bronte reserves 
the right to reject any and all 
bids and waiver a n y  
technicality.
_____________45B-2tc

BRONTE ISD
is accepting bids on the fol­
lowing items:
Classroom carpet 
Riding Lawnmower 
Copiers 
Computers
Laser Disc Players & Acces­
sories
Color Television Sets 
VCR’s
For specifications, contact, 
Michael Hartman, Supt., 915- 
473-2511.
_____________46B-2tc

BRONTE ISD
is accepting bids for renova­
tion of the football stands, re­
strooms, and concessions 
stands. For specifications and 
information, call Michael Hart­
man, Supt., 915-473-2511. 
____________46B-2tc

C itize n s h ip
S em inar

Anthony Wink of Robert 
Lee, Casey Thorn of Bronte, 
and Amy Schrader of Sterling 
City represented the Coke- 
Sterling Farm Bureau at the 
31st annual C itiz e n s h ip  
Seminar. Held at Angelo 
State University June 14-18, 
the Texas Farm Bureau semi­
nar included junior and senior 
high school students.

They were chosen because 
of their leadership ability, 
scholastic achievement and 
character, said Robert M . 
Brown, Coke-Sterling County 
Farm Bureau president.

The seminar is designed to 
give these selected high 
school students a better un­
derstanding of the various 
forms of government and their 
responsibilities as citizens. 
Comparisons of the different 
kinds of economic systems 
are outlined in lectures, films 
and discussions presented by 
leading authorities in govern­
ment, history and economics.

Personal
Sondra Hester was in Gar- 

dendale last week to visit 
daughter Mindy and family. 
Bimbo, Danya and Jeb Wright. 
Danya returned to Robert Lee 
with her grandmother for a 
week's stay. She visited with 
her great-grandmother, Marie 
Hester, and aunt and uncle, 
Joyce and Jim Wilson. On 
Saturday, Marie, Danya, and 
Sondra went to Abilene to 
see Don Hester and go to a 
shower for Lee Ann Hester. 
After returning to Robert Lee, 
the three ladies enjoyed the 
first cook-out of the season at 
WCCNH and listening to the 
music of "High Noon", Matt 
and Michael Wilson and Kyle 
Long. Mindy retrieved her 
daughter on Sunday.

June B irth d ay  Hon> 
orees at the Bronte 
Nursing Home were 
Claude Gentry and Alta 
Wilson (not pictured).

The "With It" Sunday 
school class of the First 
United M e t h o d i s t  
Church were sponsors 
for the party. Mary Bell 
Hilliard furnished enter­
tainment.

Claude also received  
his 70 year Masonic pin 
on June 8 from the Nor- 
ton-Balllnger Lodge.

...Playday Results 
(cont'd. from pg. 5)

3rd. Amber Brosh, 35.76.
Bags

1st. Lyndon Butler, 16.43; 
2nd. Heather Pfiuger, 17.65; 
3rd. Amber Brosh, 33.27.

Eoles
1st. Heather Pfiuger, 34.10; 

2nd. Charles Pfiuger, 34.11; 
3rd. Amber Brosh, 54.81. 

Goat Hair Pulling 
1st. Heather Pfiuger; 2nd. 

Amber Brosh.
10 to 12 Year Olds

Barrels
Tessie McMullan, 

2nd. Mandy Pfiuger, 
3rd. Justin Felton, 
4th. Valine Butler, 

5th. Meghan Blanek, 
6th. Brittany Barrett,

1st.
18.76;
19.35;
20.90;
21.28;
23.82;
28.07.

Bags
1st. Tessie McMullan, 9.24 

2nd. Mandy Pfiuger, 10.11 
3rd. Brittany Barrett, 10.23 
4th. Justin Felton, 10.30; 5th. 
Meghan Blanek, 10.77.

Holes
1st. Brittany Barrett, 24.79 

2nd. Valine Butler, 27.53 
3rd. Mandy Pfiuger, 28.66 
4th. Meghan Blanek, 30.11 
5th. Tessie McMullan, 34.78 
6th. Justin Felton, 42.89. 

Goat Tying
1st. Tessie McMullan, 

16.52; 2nd. Mandy Pfiuger, 
17.80; 3rd. Brittany Barrett, 
19.49; 4th. Meghan Blanek, 
20.43; Justin Felton, 22.94. 

13 to 15 Year Olds 
Barrels

1st. Brandi Brosh, 20.53 
2nd. Courtney Arrott, 20.71 
3rd. Leia Brunson, 22.85 
4th. Dusty Arrott, 30.69.

Bags
1st. Courtney Arrott, 10.27; 

2nd. Leia Brunson, 10.66; 
3rd. Brandi Brosh, 11.15; 4th. 
Dusty Arrott, 20.63.

Poles
1st. Brandi Brosh, 24.30 

2nd. Courtney Arrott, 26.83 
3rd. Leia Brunson, 29.80 
4th. Dusty Arrott, 36.50.

Goat Tying
1st. Dusty Arrott, 17.39; 

2nd. Courtney Arrott, 27.74; 
3rd. Brandi Brosh, 36.82.

"Anguished English" 
"Sir Francis Drake cir­

cumcised the world in a 
100-foot clipper."



473-2065 473-2065
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7 Days a Week

^  FOOD STAMPS WELCOME OF I
^ ■
Poi .

^Spare 
Ribs

5 LbJ>4

i I .  z  y ,

3 1/2

iBoneless Packer Trim
B risket Lb.
Lean
Ground Chuck
Top

Mon.-Sat. -7:30 am to 9 pm |
Sunday -  8 am to 7 pm 

OF BRONTE
ooœ ocoocoœ ^oocooooooiooociOicoooooooQ<

.... á
oeo

W  K
Oscar Mayer Reg. or Bun Size

1 .2 9  Wieners .99
-  Oscar Mayer Vac Pack

1.79 Bacon 1-99 Steak^
Ham

O i-  ■ - O .X 1 . .. O  f l O  Eckrich Market Sliced
Sirloin Steak- 2 .9 9  chopped Ham 1 .3 9

Parade

Paper Towels

. 3 9roll

Hunts

Ketchup
24 oz. 
Bottle . 8 9

Hormel

Potted Meat
3 oz.

Better Valu

Macaroni & Cheese
7.5 oz.

5 / $ 1
Maryland Club

Coffee
13 oz. 

can 1 . 8 9
Kleenex

Bath Tissue

Lean
Ground Chuck

10 Lbs.
1 Lb. Freezer 
Wrapped Pkg 1 6 . 9 QGooch Payton g

German Meat I
Sausage Franks I312 oz. QQPkg. ■ 57 W 'l:" 4 9 'HKg.  ̂ Ì---- ----- - 3

8 ct. pkg.

Hamburger or Hot Dog Buns . 2 9

xDr. Pepper̂  
l^or Pepsi C

“ 1.3 9i6 pack
1 ^ 1 2  oz. cans

Better Valu Pace

Bleach Picante
Sauce

S  , 8  9 16 02. C  Q
Jar 1 ■ ^

Rich & Ready f

I

?

Lemon-Lime or Orange

Slice
12 oz. cans

Reg. or Jaiapeno

Ranch Style 
Beans

2/$115 oz

16 02

Parade Squeeze

Mustard 
.69

Better Valu
Ramen Noodles

6 / $ 1

Gal.

k ñ ñKraft Parkay
Margarine

Citrus^- 
Punchy
1 - 4  9 ^

2/$11 Lb. 
Qtrs.

Parade Medium

Eggs

Pop’s Flour
Tortillas

11 ct. 
Pkg.

Parade Cheddar or Colby
Cheese •« 1.59

California Red or White

V Grapes FROZEN FOODFRESH PRODUCF
ijanay s uountry L

Peaches .7 9  ice Cream
Medium Yellow Interstate Froz

^Onions 4 /$1 Potatoes
Russet

Potatoes
iceberg

L C t t U C G  - S 0  Prices Good 6/24 Thru 6/30

10 Lb. 
Bag

Gandy's Country Charm
1/2 Gal. 

Ctn.
Interstate Frozen

2 Lb. 
Bag

Parade Frozen
12 oz. 

can

raraae f-rozen

1 .4 9  Orange Juice

FOOD STAMPS WELCOME


