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Bronte group makes plans to save theatre

i f5 ?

The Bronte Chamber of 
Commerce (COC) called a 
Town Meeting Monday night, 
January 28, to obtain the 
public's input and gauge their 
interest in the restoration of 
the old Texas Theatre in 
Bronte. Approximately fifty 
adults and a few teenagers 
gathered for a very successful 
discussion and tour that fol­
lowed the meeting.

Bronte Chamber of Com­
merce President Susan Arrott 
presided at the meeting and 
explained that a separate or­
ganization would have to be 
formed since the COC was 

A in the business of owning 
^aPestate.
* ' ' ' ' ’̂ ’̂ 'ttee to organize the 

purchase and development of 
the project was nominated 
and elected by acclamation by 
the citizens present. It con­
sists of Elmer Hurley, Pete 
Percifull, Cotton Morgan, Pat

Oglesby, Bob Huckabee, 
Cynthia Turner, and Phil Bell. 
They, in turn, appointed Pat 
Oglesby as secretary.

The Texas Theatre was built 
in 1947 by the Wojtek Broth­
ers of Robert Lee. They act­
ed as designers, architects, 
builders, etc. of the building. 
While under construction and 
with the walls half-way up, a 
big storm blew in and caused 
considerable d a m a g e .  
Therefore, the large side 
supports, visible on the out­
side of the building, were 
added.

The Texas Film Commission 
uses our theatre on their logo 
which has brought the theatre 
apH t^P town of Bronte quite a 
bit of notoriety. A word to our 
state legislators might bring 
the Commission's assistance 
in the restoration project.

The theatre was also on the 
November, 1990, cover of

Texas Monthly magazine and 
the Japanese have seen it on 
a TV commercial. Prints of the 
photograph used for the cov­
er are being sold internation­
ally.

Luis Charles, the present 
owner, closed the theatre in 
the mid-70s. Bids have been 
contracted for tearing the 
building down for salvage of 
the materials. This is the rea­
son for the urgency of any ac­
tions the community may wish 
to take to save a piece of our 
history. Price for the building, 
equipment, and the lot the 
theatre is on is $25,000.

There can be many uses for 
the old theatre. These in­
clude; the showing of movies 
- classics, new releases, and 
children's matinees: civic dra­
ma productions - possibly 
dinner theatre; school drama

(cont’d. on page 2)
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Commodities
Food Commodities will be 

distributed Thursday, Febru­
ary 7, at the Bronte and 
Robert Lee Senior Citizens 
Buildings from 8 am - 12 
noon. All commodities are 
distributed on a first come - 
first serve basis.

Gospel Singing
The Community Gospel 

Singing will be held Sunday 
afternoon, February 3, in the 
Bronte Central Baptist Church 
Fellowship Hall beginning at 2 
pm.

Everyone is invited to come 
and enjoy an afternoon of 
gospel music.

WCCCD Meeting
The West Coke County 

Community Developm ent 
meets the first M o n d a y  
evening of each month. On 
Monday, February 4, the or­
ganization will gather in the 
courtroom in Robert Lee at 7 
pm.

Gary Levine, owner of the 
North American Ostrich Farm 
located in East Coke County, 
will be the speaker.

Come and join others who 
are interested in the promo­
tion of our community.

Upcoming

Valentine Dance
West Coke County Com­

munity Development w ill 
sponsor a Valentine Dance on 
Saturday night, February 9, 8 
pm til 12 midnight in the Rec 
Hall in Robert Lee. Tickets will 
be available at the door.

Bronte PTA
The Bronte PTA will meet 

Thursday, February 7, at 7 pm 
in the school auditorium. The 
original meeting day for this 
month was Tuesday, February 
5, which was changed due to 
a conflict in scheduling.

The topic for the program 
will be "Helping Your Child to 
Stay Out of Trouble." A 
demonstration of refusal skills 
will be role played by students 
from the third and sixth 
grades. This will be followed 
by a short video presentation.

Everyone is invited to 
come.

Br. Band Boosters
The Bronte Band Boosters 

will hold their regular monthly 
meeting W e d n e s d a y  
evening, February 6, at 8 pm 
in the Band Hall.

Members of the Booster 
Club are urged to attend this 
meeting.

RL Open House
Ag West, Robert Lee 's  

newest business, an insur­
ance agency, will hold an 
Open House on F rid a y , 
February 1. Refreshments will 
be served from 9 am until 12 
noon. A gents D aryl 
Copeland, Bill Carwile, and 
George Demere will be on 
hand to acquaint area resi­
dents with their new offices at 
803 Austin Street, downtown.

40+ Dancers
The 40-t- Dance Club will 

meet at the Rec Hall in Robert 
Lee on Tuesday evening, 
February 5. The club dances 
the first Tuesday of each 
month at 7:30 pm. Tickets will 
be available at the door.

RL Youth Rally
The Southside Church of 

Christ in Robert Lee is holding 
a Youth Rally Saturday, 
February 2, at the church. 
Registration is at 4:30 pm with 
a meal to follow at 5 pm. Other 
activities will follow the meal.

All area junior and senior 
high students are invited to 
participate. For more informa­
tion, contact Greg Fleming at 
453-4613.

/

The Texas Theatre in Bronte, built in 1947 and 
now in danger of being torn down, is the focus 
of a community project to preserve a part of 
Bronte's history.

Postal increase detailed
As of February 3, the cost to 

mail letters, etc., will increase.
For the usual First-Class 

stamp, the price will go from 
250 up to 290. For a post 
card, from 150 to 190.

The present 250 stamps will 
still be accepted when ac­
companied by a "make-up" 
stamp which are available at 
the post office.

The Postal Service has also 
issued a new "Flower" stamp

worth the required 290 for 
First-Class mall service.

Until new 290 stamps can 
be printed, both the "Flower" 
stamp and the "make-up" 
stamp will remain in circulation. 
These can be used for mail 
addressed to U. S. addresses 
and also for APO/FPO military 
addresses. However, these 
stamps may not be used for 
international mail which re­
quires stamps to have a print­
ed numeric value.

Desert Prayer watch set
The choir of the Robert Lee tuary, please pause for a mo-

First United Methodist Church 
will sponsor a "Desert Prayer" 
watch from 8 am to 6 pm this 
Friday, February 1st, in the 
sanctuary of the Methodist 
Church.

This day is being set aside 
for all the community to par­
ticipate and share their con­
cern for the men and women 
serving their country in the 
Middle East. The church bell 
will ring every hour all day to 
invite all persons of every de­
nomination to come and show 
their concern. If you can't 
come to the Methodist sanc-

ment wherever you are and 
say a prayer.

We've had Desert Shield 
and Desert Storm. Now it is 
time for Desert Prayer.

CORRECTION:
In last week's haste to in­

clude the county stock show 
winner's pictures, we made a 
couple of errors. We have in­
cluded two pictures in this 
week's issue which should 
even up the score. Our 
apologies to those who were 
affected by the errors.



Page 2 Friday, February 1, 1991 The Observer/Enterprise

THE OBSERVER/ENTERPRISE
Published Weekly Except Christmas 
707 Austin (915) 453-2433
(USPS 467-480) (ISSN 8750-197X)

Second Class Postage paid at Robert Lee, TX.
POSTMASTER: Please send address 

changes to Observer/Enterprise 
PO Box 1329. Robert Lee. TX 76945.

S T A F F
Hal Spain, Publisher Joan Davis Melinda McCutchen 
Ericka Clendennen Becky Ross Patti McCorkle

SUBSCRIPTION RATES
Per Year in Coke County..................................... $12.00
Per Year Elsewhere in Texas.............................. $13.00
Per Year Outside of Texas.................................. $15.00

Obituaries

...Theatre
productions: graduations: 
seminars: and, due to the re­
moval of the first six rows of 
seats, dances. The theatre 
can seat between three and 
four hundred people.

Restoration of the Bronte 
theatre should not prove as 
costly or difficult as those un­
dertaken in area towns. This 
is due mainly to the concrete 
walls and the maintaining of a 
good roof. Ed Allcorn, first 
paid manager of the beauti­
fully restored Paramount 
Theatre in Abilene and con­
sultant to many th e a t re  
restoration organizations, told 
COC directors that the Texas 
Theatre was in good condition 
compared to others he has 
consulted on before the ir 
restorations.

A few years ago, a metal 
screwed-down roof was put 
on. All of the original projec­
tion equipment is present and 
in good working order. Even 
the popcorn machine is still 
there. The seats needing it 
were reupholstered in the

Financial aid 
meeting slated

There will be a financial aid 
meeting in the Bronte High 
School Learning Resource 
Center on Monday evening, 
February 4, 1991, at 7 pm. 
Jimmy Parker, Director of Fi­
nancial Aid at Angelo State 
University, will be the speaker. 
He will cover some very 
important items on the Family 
Financial Statement. All se­
nior parents are urged to at­
tend since Mr. Parker can give 
some very helpful pointers on 
filling out the form. He will also 
be able to answer any ques­
tions concerning the form or 
financial aid in general. He will 
not be representing Angelo 
State University.

If you have any questions 
concering this upcoming 
meeting or the information 
provided, please contact 
Vicky McCutchen at the high 
school.
County nets 
census increase
The U. S. Bureau of the 

Census has tallied preliminary 
1990 census figures for 
Texas counties, U. S. Senator 
Phil Gramm reported today.

The census figures could 
change from now until July 
15, 1991. Some counties 
might contest the preliminary 
figures and will have the op­
portunity to do so.

Coke County's preliminary 
count stands at 3,424 up from 
1980's count of 3,196.

(cont’d. from page 1)

mid-70s and are still in good 
shape.

Major renovation projects 
might include carpeting, 
plumbing, painting, replacing 
some ceiling tiles, and re-do­
ing the restrooms.

The as-yet unnamed orga­
nization has many financing 
options to look into. Glenn 
Carr of San Angelo, a member 
of the Classic Theatre Preser­
vation League, was on hand 
to provide additional informa­
tion to those in attendance. 
He mentioned that United 
Artists might be willing to do­
nate equipment and that our 
theatre would qualify for clas­
sic movies because of the 
dual projection system.

Coke County Attorney Bill 
Helwig was extremely helpful 
with the legal questions in­
volved with the project.

The building is only 44 
years old and does not qualify 
for a historical marker. In order 
to receive a marker, a building 
must be at least 50 years old.

Grants are available from 
various groups, also from es­
tates of families involved in 
theatre. However, before ap­
plying for these, a group must 
be organized and have a plan 
of action ready to present. 
The project might also be 
funded by a low-interest gov­
ernment loan.

Employment opportunities 
the theatre might provide for 
the area could include a paid 
manager, a secretary, and 
various part-time employees.

A committee meeting is set 
for Monday, February 4. The 
committee members urge ev­
eryone in the community to 
contact them with input re­
garding the restoration. Also, 
any assistance community 
members can give will be 
greatly appreciated.

Don't let a piece of Bronte's 
history die. "Save Our The­
atre."

Caperton
Leslie Dean Caperton, 53, 

of Brentwood, Tennessee, 
and formerly of San Angelo, 
died Friday, January 25, 
1991, in Brentwood.

Service was conducted at 2 
pm Tuesday, January 29, at 
the First Baptist Church of 
San Angelo with Dr. Jerold 
McBride, pastor, officiating. 
Burial followed in the Fairview 
Cemetery in Bronte, directed 
by Robert Massie Funeral 
Home.

He was born October 26, 
1937, in Bronte and had been 
living in Tennessee for 10 
years. A graduate of Texas 
Tech University in 1969, he 
was in the automobile busi­
ness all of his life. Leslie 
puchased the Mazda and 
Volkswagen dealership of 
San Angelo in 1970 and was 
there until 1976 when he 
moved to Plano to become 
the general manager of the 
Late Chevrolet Co. He later 
left Plano and became a vice 
president of the Beaman Au­
tomotive Group in Nashville, 
Tennessee.

Mr. Caperton was ordained 
a deacon in the First Baptist 
Church of San Angelo and 
was also a deacon of the Bap­
tist Church in Brentwood.

He is survived by his wife, 
Wanda Caperton of Brent­
wood: two daughters, Gayle 
Golladay of Plano and Karen 
Barnes of Phoenix, Arizona: 
one son, Kevin Caperton of 
Auburn, Alabama: a sister. 
Savannah Belcher of Odessa: 
two brothers, R. T. Caperton 
of Bronte and Matthew 
Caperton of Big Spring: and 
three grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Bobby 
Fletcher, Frank Sanders, Ed­
die Surface, C. V. "Buddy" 
Parker, Fred Homeyer, Burl 
Terrill, Joe Henderson, and 
Martin Lee.

Wojtek
Vladimir V. Wojtek, 65, died 

Saturday, January 26, 1991, 
after a lengthy illness.

Service was at 3 pm Tues­
day, January 29,1991, at Ellis 
Funeral Home chapel with 
burial in Resthaven Memorial 
Park.

He was born February 28,

Does Your Heart Good.
I  American Heart Association

Bill's Electrical Service
RB^idBntiBl*CofitinBrcial Licensed Eiectricmtf

Alt Type» Electrical Work 20 Years Experience
7 8 6 - 2 0 3 2

Dr. Clark W. Johnson - Chiropractor

BRONTE CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC
509 S. State Street - Bronte

For Health Care 9:00 AM til 2:00 PM 
TUESDAY & THURSDAY

Call (915) 473-2127

1925, in Robert Lee. He 
worked for Dawson Geo­
physical, retiring in 1985. He 
was a Marine veteran and had̂  
lived in Midland since 1961, 
previously living in San An­
gelo.

Survivors include his wife, 
lla Dean "Deanie" Wojtek of 
Midland: one son, Gary Lyyn 
Wojtek of Midland: two 
daughters, Kathy Wojtek and 
Junette Roys, both of Mid­
land: his mother, Mrs. V. V. 
Wojtek Sr. of San Angelo: five 
brothers, O. C. Wojtek and 
Marlow Wojtek, both of San 
Angelo, Robert V. Wojtek of 
San Antonio, Victor Wojtek of 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma, 
and Frankie Wojtek of Eden: 
five sisters, Beatrice Cobb 
and Nelda Williams, both of 
San Angelo, Norma Mont­
gomery of Robert Lee, Goldie 
Campbell of Fort Worth, and 
Cleta Norwood of Palestine: 
two grandchildren: and nu­
merous nieces and nephews.

Hicks
Lorena Johnston Hicks, 68, 

of Bronte, died Monday, Jan­
uary 28, 1991, at Shannon 
Medical Center in San Ange­

lo.
Services were conducted 

Thursday, January 31, at 1:30 
pm at the First Baptist Church 
in Bronte. Officiating at the 
services were Rev. Garry 
Bivins and Rev. R. W. Black­
mon. Burial was in Tuscola 
Cemetery under the direction 
of Fry Funeral Home of Tus­
cola.

Mrs. Hicks was born Febru­
ary 13, 1922, in Quitman, 
Arkansas. She married Per­
shing Hicks, Sr., in Tuscola in 
1939. Mr. Hicks preceded her 
in death in 1975.

The couple had lived in 
Tuscola and in Arizona before 
moving to Big Lake in 1950, 
and to Bronte in 1974.

Survivors include her moth­
er, Florence Johnston o f 
Quitman, Arkansas: one 
daughter, Eva Jo Lee, of Irv­
ing: two sons, Pershing Hicks, 
Jr. of O'Fallon, Illinois, and 
Jerry M. Hicks of Stillwater, 
Minnesota: four sisters: four 
brothers: six grandchildren: 
and four great-grandchildren.

Pallbearers were grandchil­
dren Connie L. Pool, Kerry D. 
Hicks, Todd Lee, Michael 
Lee, Amy M. Hicks, and An­
gela M. Hicks.

Margaret Martin, retired Project Director of 
the Bronte Senior Center, is shown hoiding 
the desk set inscribed with the foiiowing "With 
Deep Appreciation and Gratitude For Many 
Years of Dedicated Service to the Seniors of 
Coke County." Concho Vaiiey Area Agency on 
Aging.

The award was presented by Bob Weaver, 
Executive Director of Concho Vaiiey Councii 
of Governments during A iuncheon in her hon­
or in San Angeio.

O PEN  H O U S E
Ag West 

Insurance 
A ssociates

803 Austin - Robert Lee - 453-2518

Friday, February 1st 
9 am - 12 Noon

Come by our new office, visit and 
enjoy some delicious refreshments!
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Youth Rally slated for Saturday in RL
"A Resurrected Christ" is 

the theme for a Youth Rally to 
be held in Robert Lee on Sat­
urday, February 2. Students 
from Lubbock Christian Uni­
versity are leading this event 
with David Fraze, a native of 
Lewisville, Texas and current 
LCU Student Body President, 
featured as the main speaker. 
Also an eight member singing 
group, "Best Friends," will 
perform. A late afternoon start 
is planned with registration at 
4:30 pm and a meal at 5 pm. A 
devotional with lots of singing 
is next, followed by David 
Fraze and then "Best 
Friends."

All area youth who are in 
Junior High or Senior High are 
invited -  any questions you 
might have can be directed to 
Jerry Horn (453-2186) or Greg 
Fleming (453-4613).

SA Stock Show
& Rodeo slated
The San Angelo S tock  

Show and Rodeo will be held 
March 2-10, 1991. For the 
past twenty-nine years, the 
Creative Arts Department has 
been a part of the Stock Show 
and Rodeo.

They will have nine divi­
sions: 1. Clothing: 2. Foods; 
3. Hobbies & Crafts; 4. 
Needlework: 5. Flower Ar­
rangements; 6. Art; 7. Hand- 
painted China; 8. Ceramics & 
Plaster Art; and 9. Photogra­
phy.

fheir Special Contest iñ­
udes: 1. Pies; 2 .
isseroles; and 3. "For Men 
-ily."- "^hero is a $1.00 entry 

fee per entry for the Special 
Contest.

There is not an entry fee 
(except for the Special Con­
test) and entries are open to 
men, women and children. 
The deadline for entries is 
Saturday, February 2, 1991.

Entry forms will be accepted 
on Saturday, February 2 at the 
Stock Show office from 10 am 
until 4 pm. Forms will also be 
accepted from 10 am until 4 
pm at Sunset Mall. A table will 
be set up across from the 
center stage, in front of Ser­
vice Merchandise.

For more information, con­
tact the San Angelo Stock 
Show and Rodeo Office.

SA G&H Society
The San A n g e lo  Ge­

nealogical and Historical Soci­
ety will meet Tuesday, Febru­
ary 5, 1991, at 7:30 pm in the 
Fellowship Hall of the Church 
of Christ at 901 N. Main in San 
Angelo.

John C. Neilson, Librarian, 
will speak about the Ft. Con­
cho Library in San Angelo.

The Beginners' Genealogi­
cal Class, taught by Billye 
Scattergood, will be held at 
6:30 pm.

Visitors are always welcome.

Arrott named to 
Tech dean's list
Melissa Arrott, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Arrott of 
Bronte, was named to the 
Dean's List for the 1990 fall 
semester at Texas Tech Uni­
versity. Students making the 
Dean's List had to earn 
between a 3.5 and 3.9 grade 
point average and be enrolled 
for at least 12 credit hours.

Scheduled to perform at a youth rally set for 
this Saturday in Robert Lee are "Best 
Friends," a vocal group.

MIA poem applies today
[Editor's Note: The following poem was written by the 
late Mary Emily Dean in 1941 after her son, Edmond, was 
reported missing in action during World War II. Technol­
ogy and powers may change but war never does. The 
agony suffered by families and our military men and 
women make this poem as appropriate for today as it was 
40 years ago.

Edmond did come home but spent the entire war as a 
Japanese prisoner. He was a brother of late Coke Coun­
ty Judge Jeff Dean and Janet Dean Baker of Robert Lee. 
JD]

DEDICATED TO MY SON
It was just a letter from Washington,
"Missing in action" is what it said,
"Your son was serving in the Philippines."
Do prisons wall him or is he dead?

"You must meet the world with a smile" they say 
"Other mothers their sons had to give."
But how can they know how my heart is tom,
They did not suffer that he might live.

Such a little while since he was a child.
And always so willing my load to share.
I recall now the many things he did 
My dear boy then so free from care.

How he mopped the floor when I was sick.
Brought ail the clothes from off the line,
Warmed baby's milk as he watched the bread.
Helped get the children off to school on time.

But the sweetest memory of them all 
And the one to my heart most dear,
Is how we two^alone would kneel 
And I heard his childish voice in prayer.

Asking God's blessing on each one of us 
And his tone was tender and kind.
Little did I know how he'd need God,
Far away from home on the battle line.

Then I think how he sang as he milked the cows.
Also at church and at school each day.
When he volunteered "I'll be back soon" he said 
And he smiled as he went away.

He gave his best of this. I'm sure 
And my heart is warmed this to know 
But it chills with terror when sleep is gone 
And it seems my reason, too, will go.

Is he suffering, starving, maimed or diseased.
With all mercy gone and no one to care.
Or worse than death, do enemies' hands 
Hold him fast and torture him there?

Dear God, have mercy on all boys at war.
And comfort all mothers like me.

Mary E. Dean

Your young child may be able to hold onto a drinking 
glass better if you place two tight rubber bands around 
the glass an Inch or so apart. This makes it easier for 
little hands to hold.

FOOD

STAMPS

WELCOME

SUPER H

IGA
LIMIT  

I RIGHTS 

RESERVED
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5Ú1 Commerce - Robert Lee, TX
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IGA TABLERITE 
BLADE CUT

CHUCK
ROAST
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RUSSET

POTATOES
10 IB, SAG

88 c
RAWaOW

SUGAR
4 L B , BAO

$1.49
MICE N SOFT

BATH TISSUE
4 ROLL p m ,

79c
BLUE BELL 
ICE CREAM

1/2 OAL. RND. OTN.

$2.79
COCA-COLA 

or 7-UP
12 pk. - 12 02* cans

mm m W  w
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ROBERT LEE SCHOOL NEWS

Members of the Robert Lee Jr HI "A" girls 
basketball team include #43 Robbye Miilican,
#45 Christy Hendry, #32 Jaclyn Waldrop, #34 
Amanda Johnston, #33 Heather Miilican, #24 
Laura Chesshir, #55 Crystal Marquez, #50 
Angle Ibarra, #44 Eliza Arellano, and Coach 
Bolding.

Current basketball results announced
The Robert Lee Steers 

faced the Bronte Longhorns 
Thursday, January i?  in the 
Robert Lee gym for the first of 
this  ̂ basketball season's 
county contests.

The Steers fell to the H.>rns, 
32-71. Scoring for the Steers 
were Robert Rodriquez 7, 
Brent Gibbs 6, Jeff Wilkes and 
Randy Watkins 4 each, Danny 
Jackson and Stephen Epper­

son 3 points apiece, Brent 
McPeek and Michael Hayes 2 
each, and John Fluhmann 1.

In the boys' "B" team game, 
Robert Lee came away with a 
50-46 victory over Bronte. 
Scoring in the win were John 
Williams with 18, Joe Blair 12, 
Russ Horn 8, Todd Scott 7, 
and Thad Metcalf 5.

sive 48-34 victory. John 
Williams was high with 18, fol­
lowed by Todd Scott 11, Russ 
Horn 6, Thad Metcalf 6, Joe 
Blair 5, William Aldridge 1, and 
Brent Jameson 1.

LUNCH 
Monday, Feb. 4
Cheese Nachos 
Ranch Style Beans 
Tator Tots w/catsup 
Cookies 
Milk
Tuesday, Feb. 5
Grilled Cheese Sandwiches 
Vegetable Beef Soup 
Pickle Slices 
Pear Slices 
Milk
Wednesday, Feb. 6
Pinto Beans w/meat 
Tator Tots w/catsup 
Spinach
Corn Bread - Butter 
Peach Cobbler 
Milk
Thursday, Feb. 7
Pizza
Corn
Lettuce & Tomato Salad
Applesauce
Milk
Friday, Feb. 8
Sliced Turkey w/giblet gravy
Cream Potatoes
Green Beans
Hot Rolls - Butter
Sliced Peaches
Milk

The Robert Lee Steers and 
the Water Valley Wildcats 
matched up in "A" and "B" 
team action Tuesday, January 
22 .

The Robert Lee Varsity fell 
to the Wildcats 46-49 in a 
close game. Scoring for the 
Steers were Robert Ro­
driquez 11, Danny Jackson 
10, Brent McPeek 8, Brent 
Gibbs 6, Randy Watkins 5, 
Stephen Epperson 4, and 
John Fluhmann 2.

The Robert Lee "B" team 
evened things up with a deci-

Friday evening, January 25, 
saw the Steers triumph over 
Sterling City 38-55 in over­
time.

Robert Rodriquez was high- 
point for the Steers with 17, 
followed by Brent McPeek 
with 11, Danny Jackson 7, 
Stephen Epperson 7, Jeff 
Wilkes 6, Randy Watkins 5, 
and Brent Gibbs 3.

Our Aggie Medical Dic­
tionary defines fester as 
quicker.

EDITH FLEA MARKET 

OPENS JANUARY 31
Thursday - Sunday -- 10 am - 5 pm 

8 miles West Hwy. 158
S^xxxxxvxxxxvxxvxxvxxxxxxxvxvxxvooo^

WE INVITE YOU
TO BE W ITH  US FOR W ORSHIP AND STUDY 

A T ALL TH ESE SERVICES
Sundays: 10 am & 6 pm - Wednesdays: 7:30 pm

Northside Church of Christ 
Tommy Williams, Minister

453-2270
Chadboume & 9lh

or 453-2619
Robert Lee, TX

Members of the Robert Lee Jr Hi "B" girls 
basketball team include #11 Patricia Minjarez, 
#23 Amanda Sanders, #31 Krystal Carver, #50 
Rhtannon White, #42 Maranda Wojtek, #22 
Cynthia Abalos, #14 Sabrina Cowart, and 
Coach Bolding.

Elementary Honor Roll
The Robert Lee Elementary 

School recently announced 
the 3rd Six Weeks' Honor 
Roll.

3rd Grade - Curlee 
Shyla Cole 
Coke Hendry 
Dan McCown 
Jennifer Woods

3rd Grade - McCown 
B. J. Bessent 
Gina Torres

4th Grade - Ammon 
Angela Abalos 
Justin Francis 
Will Simpson

4th Grade - Davis 
Holly Copeland

Lon Eubanks 
Chad Helwig 
Mariusz Skibicki

5th Grade - Wilson 
Bree Bolding 
Eli Boxell
Dustin Ciendennen 
Stacy Thomason 
Jessica Key 
Matthew Miilican 
Stacy Hendry 
Rachel Ammon

6th Grade - Mauldin 
Jerrod Copeland 
Donny Edging 
Chad Goodman 
Meagan Hill 
Rachel Shook 
Shalon Waldrop

WINK INSURANCE AGENCY
Home*Auto

L ife *H ealth *C o m m erc ia l
715 A u stin 453-4551 J

Our 24 Hour Depository 
It’s always open 

for business!
It’s a safe place to make a deposit and a convenient 
place to make the paym ent on a loan. Use it during 
business hours if you’re in a hurry.
Our 24 hour depository  is available after hours, 
w eekends, holidays, every day of the year.
Ask abou t ou r 24 hour depository.

Robert Lee State Bank
fi ^ Member FDIC
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The Coke County Livestock Show Association 
Directors would like to thank the following 

businesses and individuals for their 
contributions to the 

1991 Coke County Livestock Show

ROBERT LEE:

Manuel Abalos-Fencing 
Contractor 

Willie Abalos 
Adams Land & Realty 
Ag West Insurance Associates 
Allen Ranch 
Scott & Casey Antilley 
Tommy & Kei Antilley 
Arledge Ranches 
Askins Propane 
Foy & Estelle Askins 
Mike & Christie Bagwell 
Baker's Grocery 
Hank Baker
Mr. & Mrs. Jeff Barnes 
Mr. & Mrs. Fred Beaty 
Bell Auto Parts 
Bell Body Shop 
Ben Bessent Chevrolet 
The Best Connection 
Mr. & Mrs. Jimmy Bickiey 
Mr. & Mrs. Biily Biair 
Marceiia Biaylock 
Mr. & Mrs. Bobby Boiding 
Paui Bosworth 
Mr. & Mrs. Ben Boykin 
Mr. & Mrs. Joe Brasher 
Mr. & Mrs. A.L. Brasuel 
Joe Brazier 
Jana Ragsdale Brisbin 
Mr. & Mrs. Edwin Brosh 
Bili & Linda Burns 
Paui & Joan Burns 
Sid & Cookie Burns 

^Butane Sales Company 
The Carousel Fashions & Gifts 
The Caston Company 
Danny & Debbie Carper 
Johnny^ & Sheila Carver 
David & Mary Chesshir 
Coke County 4-H Ciubs 
Coke County Commissioners Court 
Coke County Feed & Supply 
Coke County Pharmacy 
Coke County Rodeo Association 
Coke County Soil &

Water Conservation 
District

Coke/Sterling Farm Bureau 
Mr. & Mrs. Daryi Copeland 
Mr. & Mrs. Leslie Copeiand 
Bob Cox
Cracker Barrel Restaurant 
Mr. & Mrs. Eph Cummins 
Davis Grocery 
Add Davis
Mr. & Mrs. Bruce Deere 
Donnie & Cheryl Devoll 
Lendy & Yvonne Devoll 
Wayiand & Mary Beth Drennan 
Roy Epperson 
Mr. & Mrs. Jeff Eubanks 
Weldon Fikes 
Mr. & Mrs. Bob Fields 
Mr. & Mrs. Douglas Gartman 
Germania Insurance - 

J.A. Dunklin 
Mr. & Mrs. Jerry Gibbs 
Mr. & Mrs. Bili Green 
Bob & June Guiiey 
Mr. & Mrs. Finis Harmon 
Mr. & Mrs. Fioyd Harmon 
Bill & Audrey Helwig 
Bill Helwig-Attorney At Law 
Mr. & Mrs. Jim Herford 
Mr. & Mrs. Biily Hill 
Mr. & Mrs. William Hood 
Mr. & Mrs. Jerry Horn 
Ivey Motor Company 
J&B Lumber
Mr. & Mrs. Lane Jackson
Mr. & Mrs. John Jacobs
Juanice Jameson
Harrell & Micki Johnston
Key Feed Store
Dave & Vivian King
Mr. & Mrs. Kenneth Lackey
Tom & Eiaine Lee
Eari Lindsey
Francis Lindsey
Mike & Fran Lomas
Mr. & Mrs. Sid Long
J.F. McCabe

Wayne McCabe
Mr. & Mrs. Raymond McCutchen 
Doug & Winnie McPeek 
Irene Maples 
Mary Kay Cosmetics - 

Sharon Pit cock 
Mr. & Mrs. Wayne Mashburn 
Kevin & Kelli Meek 
Mr. & Mrs. Dub Metcalf 
Miller Liquid Feed 
Mr. & Mrs. Conrad Miiiican 
Mr. & Mrs. Finis Miiiican 
Lawana Miiiican 
Mr. & Mrs. Marshail Miiiican 
Mr. & Mrs. Teddy Miiiican

Mr. & Mrs. Tim Miiiican 
Mr. & Mrs. Waidon Miiiican 
Mr. & Mrs. Wibby Miiiican 
Mr. & Mrs. Wiibern Miiiican 
Bar M Ranch - 

Gene Montgomery 
Mountain Creek Goif Ciub 
Mountain Creek Goif Pro Shop 
Observer/Enterprise  
PCR Feed Yard 
Paul & Lynn Payne 
Francis Percifuii 
Frank Percifuii Estate 
Darrel & Sharon Pitcock 
Gaylon & Kaye Pitcock 
Mr. & Mrs. Teddy Pitcock 
Mr. & Mrs. Pete Prentice 
Mr. & Mrs. Ed Poehls 
Mr. & Mrs. J.E. Quisenberry 
Mr. & Mrs. Kenneth Rasco 
Red Canyon Gun Ciub 
Robert & Mildred Reese 
Donny & Ruth Robertson 
Billy Wayne & Dolores Roe 
Hadley & Lee Richards 
Mark & Cindy Riley 
Robert Lee All Sports 

Booster Club 
Robert Lee FFA 
Robert Lee State Bank 
Bobby & Jeffie Roberts 
Salt Creek Beefmasters 
Horace & Mary Scott 
Loyd Sevier 
Skinner's Grocery 
Mr. & Mrs. Pete Smith 
Mr. & Mrs. Randy Smith 
Wiliis & Wanda Smith 
Mr. & Mrs. John Stephens 
Super H Grocery 
Reba & Jim Tabor 
Mr. & Mrs. Jackie Tennison 
Mr. & Mrs. Jack Thomason 
Clark & Noel Tinkler 
Roy & Jennie Lee Tinkier 
Mr. & Mrs. Johnny Torres 
Mr. & Mrs. John Trice 
Dwayne Vincent 
Mr. & Mrs. Riley Waldrop 
D.J. & Nelia Walker 
Jackie Walker 
Mr. & Mrs. J.C. Wallace, Jr. 
West Texas Utilities 
Wildcat Fish-A-Rama 
Gary Sam & Nita Gaye 

Williams 
Ruth Williams 
Mr. & Mrs. L.E. Wink 
Wink Insurance Agency 
Robert & Marsha Wink 
Bob Wrinkle's Ace Hardware 
Jack & Jan Yanez

BRONTE:

All Sports Booster Club
Mr. & Mrs. LeDrew Arrott
Mike Arrott
Nick Arrott
Tim Arrott
Wayne Arrott
B&B Enterprises
Mr. & Mrs. C.B. Barbee
Mr. & Mrs. Ray Barnett
Jolene Barrett
Tony Barrett
W.C. Billingsley

Mr. & Mrs. Tom Bivins
Blair & Blair Hog Farm
Frank & Marty Blair
Dennie Braswell
Bronte Band Boosters
Bronte Chamber of Commerce
Bronte Coaching Staff
Bronte Lions Club
Burwick Oil Field Service
Butler Oil Company
Chadbourne Ranch
Wayne & Shaye Coalson
Donald Cooper
Coke County Roping Club
Mr. & Mrs. Benny Corley
Cumbie & Arrott
Mr. & Mrs. Aubrey Denman
W.H. & Lou Dismore
Joe Draper
Harold & Patsy Dunn
J. Lee Ensor
Royce Fancher
First National Bank of Bronte
Custom Fence
Glenn>Blvins Insurance
Earl & Mary Glenn
Bill & Gina Grant
Roger Graves
Mr. & Mrs. Albert Johnson
Joni'Lyn Sportswear
Michael Hartman
Highway Garage
Hometown Hardware
Bob & Susan Huckabee

Mr. & Mrs. Elmer Hurley
Steve & Sharon Kelton
Mr. & Mrs. Hurlin Lee
Eula Verne Nixon Lee
Mr. & Mrs. Martin Lee
Mr. & Mrs. Royce Lee
Mr. & Mrs. Billy Joe Luckett
Dewey Luckett
Mr. & Mrs. Joe McCutchen
Bill Magness
Margaret's Flowers & Gifts 
Charles Oliphant 
Parker Plumbing Company 
Jerry Parker
Mr. & Mrs. Jerry T. Parker 
Poehls Transport Co.
Bob Ragsdale 
Carroll A. Robbins 
Gerald Sandusky 
Mr. & Mrs. Robert A. Sanford 
Jeff & Sujane Schoenfield 
Donna Scott 
Shaffer Funeral Home 
Ronald & Beverly Sims 
Mr. & Mrs. Ronnie Thorn 
Mr. & Mrs. James Tidwell 
Billy Tounget-Ventaire 

Awning Co.
Bobby & Marlene Vaughn 
James & Janel Vaughn 
Barton & Winnie Waldrop 
West Texas Utilities 
Chester Wilson 
Wiibern Wrinkle

SAN ANGELO:
Lynn Alexander Autoplex 
Angelo Pellets 
Mr. & Mrs. J.B. Arrott 
Ashleys Boot Shop 
B&W Trailer 
Bank of the West 
Bes-Tex Insecticides 
Better Than Nothing 

Restaurant 
Bill's Man Shop 
Blake Carpet Cleaners 
Bobby, Kathey, Jason &

Cody Blaylock
Kenny Blanek Custom Catering 
Frank Book Farms 
Bowen Ranch 
Bratton T.V. & Appliance 

World
Bruton Easy-Pull Trailers 
Bryan Builders

C&W Enterprises, Inc.
The Carpet Shop

Century Trailers 
City Lumber 
Coca-Cola Bottling Co.
Dawson Coleman 
Concho Valley Electric Co-Op 
Concho Valley Implement Co. 
Crockett Co. National 

Bank of San Angelo 
Donaho Saddle Shop 
Dun Bar East Restaurant 
Eubanks Furniture Co.
Federal Land Bank of San Angelo 
Field & Stream Sporting Goods 
Gerald Fohn 
Full of Pep & Coke Co.

Feed & Supply 
GTE of the Southwest 
Gandy's Dairies
General Beverages of Texas, Inc.
Griffis, Colia, Motl Attorneys
The Hatatorium
Highland Pump Company
Holland's Jewelers
J-Bar Industries
Mr. Fred Jameson
Jim Bass Ford
Mr. & Mrs. Albert Johnson
Mr. & Mrs. Robert Junell
K-Mart
Mr. & Mrs. Elmer Kelton 
Martin Lee & Associates, Inc. 
Lone Star Gas Company 
Los Cabalios Vet Clinic 
McClanahan & Assoc.
Dale McDonald 
M-System #8 
Mid-West Feed Yards 
Mr. Boots 
Mustang Chevrolet 

. Nathans Jewelers 
North American Ostrich 

Collective, Inc.
North Concho Vet Clinic 
The Outdoorsman 
Palmer Feed & Supply, Inc.
Pierce Masonry 
Pinon Petroleum 
The Pool Company 
Producers Livestock 
Dr. Jack Rice 
R.V. Refrigeration 
Randall Motors

Rushing Sheffield & Company 
V.L. Ryan
Samuels Hardware 
San Angelo Air Cooled Engines 
San Angelo Ford Tractor 
San Angelo Systems, Inc.
Sears
Seed Mart, inc.
Shakey's Pizza 
Shannon West Texas 

Memorial Hospital 
Gladys Maye Sims 
Southern Sea 
Southwestern Stockman 

Supply
Southwestern Welding 

Supply Co., Inc.
St. Johns Hospital 
Standard Times 
Stribling Appraisals 
Swartz Oil Company 
Twin Mountain Supply 
Karl Vancil
Webb, Stokes, Parker, Choate 
Wendland Manufacturing 
West Texas Cablevision 
West Texas Steel & Supply 
West Texas Vet Clinic 
Wilson Buick GMC 
Mr. & Mrs. Victor Wojtek 
Zetners Steak House

OTHERS:
Alderman-Cave 
Frank & Marianne Antilley 
Ballinger Feed & Seed, Inc. 
Ballinger Tire & Service, Inc. 
Ballinger Wool & Mohair 
Curtis & Sallie Barrett 
Mr. & Mrs. Marvin Bedford 
Charles Bahiman Chevrolet, Inc.

Bill's Propane
Mr. & Mrs. Clayton Bloodworth 
Mr. & Mrs. Raymond Bloodworth 
Mr. & Mrs. W.A. Bloodworth 
Cervenka Coke County 

Cattle Co.
Clendennen, Inc.
Cox Quality Meats 
Mr. & Mrs. Felix Dozier 
Dale & Ida Lee Ellis 
Ezell-Key Grain Company 
Farmers Seed & Supply 
Faubion Implement Co.
First National Bank 

of Ballinger 
First National Bank of 

Rotan-Ballinger Branch 
First National Bank of 

Sterling City 
J.R. Fuller Foods, inc. 
Funderberg, Inc.
H&H Tire
W.A. & Jeraldine Hickman 
Hickman, Halligan, Jordan 

Ranches
Danny & Barbara Heathcott
Higginbotham Brothers & Co.
Clay & Martha Hill
Hill County Well Service
Ray Gene Hoelsher
Jackson Construction
Billy & Kathy Jackson
Mr. & Mrs. J.P. Jameson
Mr. & Mrs. Larry Jameson
Jedd Manufacturing Co.
Kothmann Commission
Lange Printing & Office Supply
Ed Lee's Services
Bob Loyd LP Gas Company
McGuire Well Service
Mac Oil Field Co., Inc.
Mathers & Son 
Matlock Farm & Supply 
Miles Locker Plant 
Dalton & Gladys Miiiican 
Mr. & Mrs. David B. Miiiican 
Mitchell County Vet Clinic 
Joe Morren, CPA 
Myers Auto Parts 
Oil Well Supply 
Oryx Energy Company 
Pioneer Vet Clinic 
Joe Prichard 
Rowena Pellet Mill 
Maverick Liquor Store 
Silver Peak Grocery 
Spindle S Ranch 
Sweetwater Electric

Const. & Maintenance, inc. 
Talbott Oil Company 
Texanna Ranch 
Toliver Brothers, Inc.
Bruce & Marty Vaughn 
Wal-Mart of Ballinger 
Well Co-Op Gin
West Texas Equipment Company 
Jerry Wilkes 
Doug & Debbie Wilkes 
Clifford & Suzie Wilson 
Wingate Gin Corp.
Winters Meat Processing 
Woods Boots 
George Wyatt 
Yoakum County State Bank

A Special thanks to 
those who helped  
with the Bar-B-Que:

Roy Tinkler  
Fred Beaty 
Mike Bagwell 
Milburn Wink

Special thanks also 
to all the d irectors’ 
wives who brought 

f o o d .
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Longhorn roundball stats published
The Longhorns played host 

to Sands Tuesday, January 
22, and added another victory 
to their record, 64-47.

Sean Conway led the scor­
ing attack with 24 points and 
13 rebounds. Justin Phillips 
and Bill Windham scored in 
double figures also with 21 
and 11 points respectively. 
Phillips contributed 12 re­
bounds, 6 assists, and 7 
steals and Windham added 5 
assists.

Jason Pierce had 4 points 
with 4 assists and Brandon 
Marshall put in 4 points and 
had 3 steals.

The Longhorns faced the 
Water Valley Wildcats last Fri­
day, January 25, and came 
away with a 58-53 victory to 
make their District record a 
perfect 5-0.'

Monday, Feb. 4
Orange Juice 
Cereal 
Toast 
Milk
Tuesday, Feb. 5
Sausage
Apricots
Biscuit
Milk
Wednesday, Feb. 6
Scrambled Egg 
Apple Juice 
Toast 
Milk
Thursday, Feb. 7
Cheese w/hashbrowns
Fruit Cup
Toast
Milk
Friday, Feb. 8
Peanut Butter 
Orange Juice 
Toast 
Milk

LUNCH 
Monday, Feb. 4
Chicken Patties 
Mashed Potatoes 
Green Beans 
Rolls 
Milk
Apricots
Tuesday, Feb. 5
Burrito
Nachos w/cheese
Pinto Beans
Salad
Milk
Cookie
Wednesday, Feb. 6
Turkey
Sweet Potatoes w/apples
Green Beans
Rolls
Milk
Peach Cobbler 
Thursday, Feb. 7
Pizza
Salad
Milk
Jello w/fruit 
Friday, Feb. 8
Hamburger
Lettuce, tomato, pickle
French Fries
Milk
Brownies

The Horns had a strong 24- 
14 lead at the end of the first 
quarter and didn't let up on 
their opponents in the sec­
ond quarter as they led 35-22 
at halftime.

Coming out on fire in the 
second half, the Horns held a 
commanding 43-28 lead less 
than halfway through the third 
quarter.

At the beginning of the 
fourth quarter, the Bronte 
team held a ten point iead, 45- 
35. Their opponents started a 
comeback drive, but were not 
strong enough to take the win 
away from the mighty 
Longhorns.

The Horns shot 50% in the 
first half with Phillips and 
Windham hitting two 3-point­
ers each.

Windham was high-point 
man with 19 points and 3 as­
sists. Phillips made 17 points 
and had 9 rebounds, 4 as­
sists, and 4 steals. Jason 
Pierce put in 8 points with two 
of them being two key free 
throws with 1:35 left in the 
game. Brandon Marshall and 
Sean Conway each had 7 
points with Conway pulling 
down 7 rebounds and 4 steals 
and Marshall taking 3 steals.

The Lady Longhorns im­
proved their record to 15-6 
last week with victories over 
Sands and Water Valley.

The Ladies d e f e a t e d  
Sands, 63-36, last Tuesday 
night, January 22. Darla Scott 
led the way with 20 points and 
16 rebounds, Jami Morrow - 
14 points and 6 assists, An­
gela Davis - 11 points and 4 
steals, Teresa Vaughn - 10 
points and 5 assists, Alisa 
Richards - 6 points, and Eboni 
Taylor - 2 points and 10 re­
bounds.

Last Friday night, January 
25, the Ladies ran over the 
Water Valley Lady Wildcats by 
a score of 69-20 to improve 
their district record to 4-1. 
Teresa Vaughn led jhe  way 
with 11 points, 11 rebounds, 
11 steals, and 6 assists. She 
was followed by Darla Scott 
with 24 points and 10 re­
bounds, Jami Morrow - 11 
points, Eboni Taylor - 9 points 
and 8 rebounds, Angela Davis 
- 4 points, Amie Parker - 4 
points, Alisa Richards - 4 
points, and Kristie Cooper - 2 
points.

The Longhorn Junior Varsi­
ty Basketball Team won the 
second place trophy at the Iri­
on County JV Tournament 
last weekend.

The Round Robin Tourna­
ment saw Bronte and Robert 
Lee matched up in the first

game Thursday evening. 
Robert Lee took the win 37- 
2 1 .

Jacob Golson had 7 points; 
Justin Stensby 4 points; Brian 
Hall 4 points; Jay Parker 3 
points; and John Lewis 3 
points.

Saturday morning, the  
Horns downed Menard, 54- 
40. Parker put in 20 points; 
Goison 13 points; Stensby 10 
points; Nathan Barnett 9 
points; Hall 2 points; and Larry 
Franklin 2 points.

The Bronte team proved to 
be too much for Irion County 
as they took an easy 53-40 
win.

Justin Stensby was high 
point with 19. Parker had 12; 
Barnett 9; Hall 7; Golson 4; 
and Jamie Flores 2.

by Lindsey Burwick 
Manager

This past weekend, the 
Shorthorn "B" teams played in 
the Robert Lee "B" team 
tournament.

The "B" girls won their first 
game against Robert Lee, 7-
3. Scorers were Melinda 
Mackey 5 and Christy McKin­
ney 2.

The second game was a 
loss to Sterling City at 4-6. 
Scorers were Melinda Mackey 
2 and Cheryl King 2. Their 
record is 2-4-1.

The "B" boys won their 
game against Robert Lee, 11- 
10. Scorers were Terry 
Queen 6, Gary Walker 3, and 
Clint Scott 2.

In the second game, they 
lost to Sterling City, 20-8. 
Scorers were Clint Scott 4, 
Gary Walker 2, and Cory 
Robinson 2. Their record is 2-
4.

Class favorites 
chosen at BHS
Classes at Bronte High 

School recently elected class 
favorites for this year.

Those chosen were: Se­
niors Brian Arrott and Misti 
Ensor; Juniors James Wilson 
and Sonja Salser; Sopho­
mores Jason Blaylock and 
Jami Morrow; and Freshmen 
Gary Bilbrey and Daphne 
Balderas.

P A R K E R  P L U M B IN G

Residential-Commercial 
All Types Plumbing Repair

*N ew  C onstruction  
♦ R em o d elin g  
♦ F ix tu res   ̂ ' '
♦Sewer Service

Licensed Master Plumber 
473-2131 Bronte

I GLENN-BIVINS INSURANCE
H om e  - Auto  - Life  - H ealth

rounjKikpendint] ̂tmumn /¡âoenTj
123 W. Main 

Bronte, Texas 76933 
(915) 473-6791

Phillips named to award
Justin Phillips, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Lynn Phillips, was 
named the Abilene Reporter- 
News Area Basketball Player 
of the Week Friday, January 
18.

Phillips, a 6-2 senior for­
ward, has shown all-around 
ability on the court as he has 
helped lead the Longhorns to 
their first place standing in 
District 27-A.

Justin, a member of last 
season's Reborter-News All- 
Area Basketball Team, scored 
17 points Friday night to help 
his team to a 58-53 victory 
over Water Valley.

Rated #10 in the State, 
Coach Rocky Rawls and the 
Longhorns are 5-0 in District 
action and 18-3 for the sea­
son.

Williams named 
to TSTI honor roll

Steve O. Williams of Bronte 
is listed on the Dean's Honor 
Roll for the Fall quarter at 
Texas State Technical Insti­
tute (TSTI) in Waco.

Williams, a student in the 
Floriculture and Ornamental 
Horticulture Technology pro­
gram, is the son of E. G. 
Collins, and a graduate of 
Bronte High School.

The Dean's Honor Roll rec­
ognizes the scholastic 
achievement of students with 
a grade point average be­
tween 3.5 and 3.9.

March 15 deadline 
for scholarships

High School students who 
are interested in applying for 
$1,000 college scholarships 
should request applicationns 
by March 15, 1991 from Edu­
cational Communications 
Scholarship Foundation, 721 
N McKinley Road, P.O. Box 
5002, Lake Forest, IL 60045-

Justin Phillips

5002. To receive an applica­
tion, students should send a 
note stating their name, ad­
dress, city, state, zip code, 
approximate grade point 
average and year of gradua­
tion. All requests for applica­
tions will be fulfilled on or 
about April 15, 1991. Seven­
ty-five winners will be selected 
on the basis of academic per­
formance, involvement in ex­
tracurricular activities and 
need for financial aid.

Actors chosen for 
one-act play

Try-outs were held for the 
1991 Bronte High School 
One-Act Play, "The Inexperi­
enced Ghost," last Monday 
with many good student ac­
tors vying for cast roles.

Chosen to perform in this 
year's play were: Brian Arrott - 
inexperienced ghost; Julie 
Blair - Estelle Clayton; Lee 
Sonnenberg - Nigel Clayton; 
Melissa Bivins - Eloise^. 
Sanderson; Casey Thorn - 
Andrew Sanderson; Misty 
Golson - Margaret Evansr .< 
Courtney Shaffer - Christo­
pher Evans; Jennifer John­
son - Angela Wishfort; Walter 
King - Michael Wishfort; and 
Wendy Huckabee and Amy 
Bailey as Burton.

The play will be presented 
in Zone competition March 
19.

UJe Haue B.O. UJater & Ice
H u n t 's 8 oz. can

TOMATO SAUCE 
COCA-COLA
or 7-UP 12 pk. cans

Sun S w eet

PRUNES 12 oz. pkg.
P a r a d e

CRACKERS
W hite C loud

BATH TISSUE
P a r a d e

OLEO SPREAD

6 /9 9 c  

$2 .59  

99c 

79c
4  roll pkg. 79c 

111 ‘ “ '’ 2 / 9 9 C

l# B O X

C a m p b e ll's  16 oz. can

PORK & BEANS 2 /  9 9 C
Specials good 1 - 5 1 - 9 1  th ru  2 - 6 - 9 1  

REMEMBER OUR MEN IN THE PERSIAN GULF
Eat in or take out plates.

BBQ, Beans, Trimmings, Sandwiches

Davis Grocery & Gas
North Hwy. 208 - Robert Lee - 453-2488
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Rocky smoothes Horns
[Editor's Note: The following 
article was printed in the Abi- 
lene Reporter News recently.] 

Bronte Is Rolling 
Through One More 

’Rocky’ Season
by Mark Wilson 

In the midst of an eighth 
straight "Rocky" season, 
things have been going just 
about as smooth as ever for 
the Bronte boys basketball 
team.

The "Rocky" factor comes 
from Rocky Rawls, in h is 
eighth season as head coach 
of the Longhorns. Bronte, 
18-3 and ranked No. 10 in the 
state in Class A by the Texas 
Association of Basketball 
Coaches, was ranked as high 
as fifth earlier this season.

The Longhorns are the only 
team Rawls has coached 
since graduating from South­
western University in 1983, 
and he has an impressive 
.838 winning percentage to 
this point. Rawls is already 
sneaking up on his 200th vic­
tory, with a career record of 
192-37.

Under Rawls, Bronte has 
reached three regional tour­
nament finals In the last four 
years, and won six consecu­
tive district championships. 
The 1987 squad reached the 
state championship game be­
fore falling, 71-39, to a pow­
erhouse Paducah team that 
also won the crown the fol­
lowing year.

Last s e a s o n ,  the 
Longhorns were ranked sixth 
^n ^p o s^d  the best record in 
chool history, at 3 2 -2 .  

Bionte made it to the Region 
i-ATournament final before 

.osing to second-ranked San­
to, the eventual state champi­
on, 60-54, A loss to Bangs in 
a practice game snapped a 
28-game Bronte w inn ing  
streak.

The three losses this sea­
son all came in tournament 
play, to larger schools. Bronte 
lost to Class 4A Monahans, 
which owns a 13-8 season 
record, and Class 3A Lubbock 
Roosevelt (8-14) in the Mid­
land Greenwood Tournament, 
and to Class 2A Hamlin (18-8) 
in the Roscoe Tournament.

Despite losing six seniors to 
graduation, including three 
starters, Rawls said that the 
Longhorns have shown im­
provement in some areas.

"They're real similar teams," 
Rawls said. "This year's team 
is playing a little better de­
fense, and this team's a better 
3-point shooting team. It's re­
ally a high-percent shot for 
about three of them."

The Longhorns have been 
nailing 38% of their shots from 
3-point range this season, 
shooting 18 attempts per 
game.

"We're more a fast-break 
type team," Rawls said. "We'd 
rather run, but we play both 
ways. We like to press and 
run when we can."

Despite the fast pace the 
Longhorns often use, they 
average just 11 turnovers per 
game.

Four-year letterman Justin 
Phillips, a 6-2 senior wing, is 
shooting 42% from beyond 
the 3-point line. He is aver­
aging 20 points, 11 re­
bounds, four steals and four 
assists per outing this season. 
Phillips, a three-year starter 
and two-time all-district per­
former, was a second-team 
TABC all-state selection, a 
first-team all-region pick, and a 
member of the Repor ter- 
News All-Area team last sea­
son.

"He's a great player, as far as 
I'm concerned," Rawls said. "I 
don't think there's anybody 
better in this area. And, he's 
just as good defensively as he 
is offensively."

Bill Windham, a 5-11 senior 
point guard, contributes 14 
points and eight assists a 
game. Windham, also a four- 
year letterman and three-year 
starter, was a second-team 
TABC all-region pick a year 
ago, and was named all-district 
for the second time.

"In my style of play. Bill's as 
important as anybody else," 
Rawls said. "As a point guard, 
he's the best I've ever had. 
Bill and Justin are the back­
bone of the team, there's no 
doubt."

One of the players who 
filled a starting spot for the 
Longhorns is 6-1 senior post 
Sean Conway. All Conway 
has done is shoot with 82% 
accuracy from the field in the 
first four district games. Con­
way, who has had 9-of-9 and 
8-of-8 shooting performances 
this season, has made 61% of 
his shots for the season, and 
is averaging 18 points and 
eight rebounds. With the 
graduation of James Badgett, 
a standout scorer and re­
bounder, Conway has made 
his own mark this season.

"He's probably the biggest 
surprise of the year," Rawls 
said. "He has really filled in 
well for (Badgett). That was 
probably our biggest question^ 
mark as the year began."

Jason Pierce, a 6-0 senior,: 
is the other starting post. The 
three-year letterman is aver­
aging seven points and five

The Mighty Bronte Longhorn Varsity Basketball team includes (l-r) 
#10 Luke Robbins,"#31 Bill Windham, #42 Justin Stensby, #25 
Sean Conway, #21 Darrel Lucas, Coach Rocky Rawls, #23 Justin 
Phillips, #13 Jason Pierce, #33 Billy Magness, #14 Shayne Crum- 
pler, and #00 Brandon Marshall. Managers of the team are Jess 
Percifuli (I) and John Thomas.

rebounds a game.
"Man-to-man, he's our best 

defensive player," Rawls said 
of Pierce. "He gets to guard 
the other team's best scorer 
every time out."

Brandon Marshall, a two- 
year letterman, is starting at 
the other guard position. The 
5-8 senior averages eight 
points and three assists.

The reserves are senior 
post Billy Magness and juniors 
Darrell Lucas, a 6-3 wing, and 
Shayne Crumpler, a 6-0 post. 
Magness and Lucas are re­
turning lettermen.

Bronte's defense has al­
lowed an average of just 42 
points per game, while the of­
fense has been scoring at a 
62-point clip.

"The key to this team is un-

selfishness," Rawls observed. 
"These kids have been play­
ing together since the eighth 
grade. They just know how to 
play with one another. They 
just mesh real well."

When Rawls coached 
Bronte to the Class A state 
championship game in 1987, 
the current crop of seniors 
were eighth graders.

"That's had a big impact on 
these kids," Rawls said. "That 
same year, they went unde­
feated in junior high. Wind­
ham and Phillips were man­
agers of that team.

"The goal they set was to go 
to the state tou rnam en t .  
That's a high, lofty goal, but 
you never know. The loss to 
Santo (last season) has moti­
vated these kids a bunch.

"We'll have to peak at the 
right time. To get past the re­
gional tournament, you've got 
to have a lot of luck. If we 
shoot the ball well, we'll have a 
pretty good chance."

Although no Bronte team 
had won as many as 32 games 
before last season, the 
Longhorns are still seeking 
their first state championship. 
Rawls may also draw a degree 
of personal motivation as he 
remembers his own senior 
year in high school at Class 3A 
Dimmitt, when his team nar­
rowly lost in the state fnal to 
Whitehouse, 60-59.

"Any coach with any ambi­
tion at a l l . . .  that's going to be 
your desire," Rawls said. "I'd 
like to go more than anybody 
in the world."

Got Something You Don’t Need?

Put It In The Classifieds!

BISD February calendar
The Bronte School Special 

Events Calendar for February 
begins with High School bas­
ketball games Friday, Febru­
ary 1st, in Garden City begin­
ning at 4 pm. It continues with 
junior high games against 
Water Valley on the 4th in the 
local gym at 5 pm.

Tuesday, February 5, sees 
teams from both county high 
schools in the Bronte gym for 
their second match-up of the 
season. The games will begin 
at 4 pm and will end the district 
play.

Basketball playoff sched­
ules are tentatively set as fol­
lows: Girls' Bi-District - Febru­

ary 14-16; Girls' Area - Febru­
ary 18-19; Girls' Regional - 
February 22-23; Girls' State - 
Februaiy 28-March 2; Boys' 
Bi-District - Febri /  21-23; 
Boys' Area - February 25-26; 
and Boys' Regional - March 1-
2.

In other news, there will be a 
West Texas Scholars meeting 
Saturday, February 16 at 12 
noon. Monday, February 18, 
will be a school holiday in ob­
servance of Presidents Day. 
In the final note of the month, 
the end of the 4th Six Weeks 
will fall on Tuesday, February 
26.

Everybody Reads 'Em

BSERVER/
NTERPRISE

Serving Coke County

Bronte
473-2001

Robert Lee 
453-2433
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Let's remember our servicemen
The crisis in the Middle East has far-reaching effects-not 

only in the nature of the crisis itself, but for the many 
servicemen and women who have been stationed there with 

the United States Armed Forces.

If you have a son or daughter or a husband or wife from Coke 
County stationed in Saudi Arabia or on board a ship 

somewhere in the Persian Gulf, the Observer/Enterprise 
would like to print their name and mailing address so that our 
readers can send letters and cards of encouragement during 

the time they are stationed so far away from home.

Send names and addresses to:
The Observer/Enterprise, PO Drawer O, Bronte, TX 76933 

or PO Box 1329, Robert Lee, TX 76945.

CpI. Gregory Grim
457-53-7701
Eco 1/18 197th Inf. Bde.
APO New York, 09315
CpI. Cixto Saucedo 
450-191425, MW SS 374 
MTd,
APO San Francisco, CA 
96608 6052

Eric Martin 
459-63-9923 
Co. B. 1/8 CAV ICD 
APO NY 09306-0230

PFC Self, Jimmy R.
HHT1/7 CAV 
CAB1CP
APO NY 09306-0330

Spc. Cole, Greg E. 
453-04-9932
HHB XVIII ABN. Corps. Arty. 
APO NY 09657

Jimmy D. Bell 
SS 449-53-7242 
3rd PLT B Co. 2/5 Cav 1st CD 
APO. NY 09306-0110

RL Literary Team 
nets 12 medals

The Robert Lee Literary 
Team went to their first prac­
tice UIL meet for this year on 
Saturday, January 26, at 
Ozona High School. The 
team scored 141 points and 
brought home 12 medals.

The Robert Lee results are 
as follows:
Reaav Writing 
Sheibi Grim - 3rd 
Literary Criticism 
Wendy Lamar - 2nd 
Janet Pentecost - 3rd

Lori Wink - 1st 
LD Debate 
Krista Green - 3rd 
Persuasive 
Carrie Davis - 3rd 
Informative 
Brandy Hayes - 2nd 
Calculator Applications 
Brent McPeek - 2nd 
Number Sense 
Eli Arellano - 3rd 
Prose
Brandy Hayes -1 st 
Carrie Davis - 6th 
Poetry
Brent Gibbs - 2nd 
Lori Wink - 3rd

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Vaughn

Vaughn, Dunn marry
Yep! They finally did it! 

Bruce Vaughn and Marty 
Dunn tied the knot December 
29th. The wedding was held 
at the Dunn residence 
somewhere around 6:30 pm. 
Family and friends celebrated 
with the couple by moving

south to the Boots & Saddles 
Club in San Angelo, where 
lots of fun was had by all.

"This has been a long time 
coming and our thanks go to 
all who shared in our happi­
ness. We finally did it!"

Bruce and Marty Vaughn

REPORT OF CONDITION
Consolidating domestic subsidiaries of the

________ national bank ___________
Name of Bank

ÌR0NTE

in the state o f . TEXAS , at the close of business on__VECEMBER 31, —  , 1990
published in response to call made by Comptroller of the Currency, under title 12, United States Code, Section 161. 
Charier Number______12723 Comptroller of the Currency-------------- ELE1/EMT(/--------------------------------District

T. S. G. Drew Henderson 
USAF
461-13-5590 
1 T FW/HC Deployed 
Operation Desert Shield 
APO New York 09894

PFC Leo Saucedo 
450-19-1436 
H&S Co. Maint. Pit.
3rd Tank BN
FTO San Francisco, C A 
96608-6052

Sgt.'Roll, Craig A.
459-295-064
Bravo Co. - 4th, 2nd AAVBN 
FPO New York 095020198

PFC Christina Sowell
455-77-8576
HQS - Det, G-1 - Manpower
IstFSSG, FMF
APO San Francisco, CA
96608-5702

Spc. Douglas G. Martin, Jr. 
451-47-3345 
Operation Desert Shield 
ACO 51st SIG. Bd., 93rd Sig. 
Bde
APO New York 09650

Airman Douglas S. Jordan 
Operation Desert Storm 
1709 CAMS 
Box 348
APO NY. NY 09697

RLJH "B" tourney action
The Robert Lee Jr High "B" 

Team Tournament was held 
Saturday, January 26, in the 
local gym. Each team invited 
played two games each.

Both the Robert Lee boys 
and girls teams went up 
against their Bronte neigh­
bors for the first game. The 
boys fell in a tight game, 10- 
11. Scoring for the Dogies 
were Daniel Hayes 5, and Eric 
Torres and Jason Key with 2 
apiece. The girls fell 3-7 to 
the Bronte girls. Scoring for 
Robert Lee were Krystal

Carver 2 and Maranda Wojtek 
1.

The Dogie teams next 
played teams from Miles and 
were victorious in both 
games. The girls took a nice 
15-8 win. Putting points on 
the board were Patricia Min- 
jarez 7, Maranda Wojtek 4, 
and Amanda Sanders and 
Cynthia Abalos with 2 each.

The boys won over Miles, 
20-15. Adding in the win 
were Tray Taylor 8, Jason Key 
6, Daniel Hayes 3, David Milli- 
can 2, and Eric Torres 1.

WALKER’S
INCOME TAX SERVICE
802 Commerce - Robert Lee

Jackie Walker
15 Yr. Experience - 11 in RL

PHONE  -  453-2516

FORM 1040 EZ $ 8.00
1040 A $ 10 .00
1 0 4 0 $10.00 & Up

Office Hours Mon. thru Fri.

statement of Resources and Liabilities

Cash and balances due from depository institutions:
Noninterest-bearing balances and currency and coin....... .....................
Interest-bearing balances..............................................................................

Securities...........................................................................................................
Federal funds sold............................................................................................
Securities purchased under agreements to rese ll....................................
Loans and lease financing receivables:

Loans and leases, net of unearned income.............................................
LESS: Allowance for loan and lease losses...........................................
LESS: Allocated transfer risk reserve .....................................................
Loans and leases, net of unearned income, allowance, and reserve .

Assets held in trading accounts.................................................................
Premises and fixed assets (including capitalized leases).........................
Other real estate owned..................................................................................
Investments In unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies
Customers' liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding..................
Intangible assets..............................................................................................
Other assets................................. ..................................................................
Total assets........................... ............................................................................
Losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823(j)............................................
Total assets and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 1823(j)...............

Thousands of dollars

5.9S3
m .

Deposits:
In domestic offices..............................................................................

Noninterest-bearing........................................................................
Interest-bearing................................................................................

Federal funds purchased...................................................................
Securities sold under agreements to repurchase .......................
Demand notes issued to the U.S. Treasury........................................
Other borrowed m oney..........................................................................
Mortgage indebtedness and obligations under capitalized leases .
Bank's liability on acceptances executed and outstanding.............
Notes and debentures subordinated to deposits...............................
Other liabilities.........................................................................................
Total liabilities............................... ........................................................
Limited-life preferred stock.....................................................................

.XiJQi.

Perpetual preferred stock............................................................................
Common stock...............................................................................................
Surplus.......................................................................... -.................................
Undivided profits and capital reserves......................................................
LESS: Net unrealized loss on marketable equity securities......................
Total equity capital...........................................................................................
Losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 18230)........................................
Total equity capital and losses deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 18230) 
Total liabilities, limited-life preferred stock, equity capital, and losses 

deferred pursuant to 12 U.S.C. 18230)..................................................

S49
(■>00

10.072
S2JL

5.812

403-jzr

JIL
.11.2Û.7

J L
19.207

J L
181

17,363
0

150
1.644

1,844

1,844

19, 207

We, the undersigned directors, attest to the correctness of 
this statement of resources and liabilities. We declare that it 
has been examined by us, and to the best of our knowledge 
and belief has jpeen  prepared in conformance with the 
instructions and is true and correct.

JÛI.E14E BARRETT

ASST. CASHIER

Ì 17.182 ~ 1

of the above-named bank do hereby declare that this Report 
of Condition is true and correct to the best of my knowledge 
and belief.

Directors

Signature

1— 28— 91
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^  FOOD STAMPS WELCOME f c l ^
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OPEN
473-2065 .  ̂_ ----- - ,7 Days a Week

STORE HOURS
Mon.-Sat. -7:30 am to 8 pm

Sunday -  8 am to 7 pm 
OF BRONTE

Jimmy Dean

PORK ' ">• pi's- 
SAUSAGE $ 1.79

I ----- Boston Butt

BOSTON BUTT PORK
„ PORK ROAST S  $1 .39  H o rm e l

^  Louis Rich Ground LITTLE 12 oz. pkg.

 ̂ LB. /K ■! ^ r t  /  TURKEYi b re, 99c
V  $  I - I 9 ^  Sa M ^ SIZZLERS $ 1.39

^ CUBE STEAK
Boneless

j j  ^  ~  —  \ \  I l / ^ I V I  |_g Eckrich Chopped

HALVES $1 .59  HAM .49
A,

Total Instant Betty Crocker
OATMEAL BROWNIE SUPREME

a i«  $  1  - 4  9

23.5 OZ. ■■■
•”  $ 1 . 5 9

Betty Crocker Blueberry
MUFFIN MIX

Trix & Total
CEREAL

t r  $  1 , 4 9 “ ^  1 , 9  9

DEVILED HAM
Wolf Plain
CHILI

4.5 oz. ^  "4 O Q 
can ^  i  m ^ can $ 1 , 5 9

Whole Boneless

SIRLOIN
12#-14# Avg. lb. 
Cut & Freezer 
Wrapped FREE

5 # 
Bag

PARADE
FLOUR

79c
ALPO

15 oz. 
can

DOG FOOD

2/$1
Clover Club

POTATO CHIPS ’ $1.79
= ^COCA-COLA

12 PK. 12 OZ. CANS
■ -X

2 / $ 5

HI-DRI

PAPER
TOWELS

Roll

59c

MARYLAND CLUB

COFFEE
13 OZ can 
All Grinds

$ 1 . 5 9
LEMON

65 oz. box

CASCADE
$2.79

TIDE BLEACH OR REGULAR

DETERGENT
$ 6 . 9 9

136 oz. 
box

ERA HEAVY DUTY

DETERGENT
$ 2 . 9 964 OZ 

btl.

IVORY

BAR SOAP
4 bar pkg. 99c

GOLDEN KRUST

BREAD
1 1/2 lb. loaf

$

GANDY'S 
SLIM & TRIM

MILK
99c

24 oz. ctn.
Gandy's Slim & Trim

COTTAGE
CHEESE $ 1 . 3 9
Bluebonnet Spread
OLEO 3 LB. BOWL $ 1 . 6 9
Parade Texas Style

FLAKY <=' p̂9 
BISCUITS 5 9 c

RUSSET

POTATOES

FRESH PRODUCE

99c
G Ìapefru ir$  1 . 9 9

Fresh

Broccoli
Arizona

1/2 gal. ctn.
2 / $ 3

Jalapeno

Peppers lb 9 9 C
Yellow

ONIONS r s  29c

Gandy's Slim & Trim

Ice  
Milk
Citrus Hill Frozen i6oz. can

Orange Juice $1.89
Parade r ^ f \
Pie Shells 2 ct. pkg. w 9 C

Prices Good 1-31 thru 2-6
FOOD STAMPS WELCOME
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FOR SALE - 1977 LTD - 
does not run - body in great 
shape - needs engine. Make 
offer. Call Lee Starling at 453- 
2229, Robert Lee. 
_____________25-2tP

BUY
SELL

IT.
IT.

F IN D  IT.
C L A S S I F I E D

CLASSIFIED 
ADVERTISING RATES

1st. Insertion...
20c Per Word 

($3.00 Minimum) 
2nd. and Subsequent 
Insertions...

16c Per Word 
($2.50 Minimum)

Additional 50c 
for Blind Ads 

Cards/Thanks...
20c Per Word

Legal Notices...
20c Per Word

COPY DEADLINE
Class Ads..5 pm Tues. 

Display Ads..5 pm Tues. 
Classified Ads & Cards of 

Thanks are payable in 
ADVANCE unless customer 
carries regular account.

C FOR SALE D
NICE HOMES in Robert 
Lee for sale. 655-0370, 
evenings.
_____________ 21-tnc

FIREWOOD FOR SALE -
Dick's Firewood, 453-2151, 
Robert Lee.
_____________07-tnc

LAVE MONEY on this pur­
chase, seller offers to pay 
portion of closing costs. 
Central Heat/Air, living & den 
areas. Call for details.
OWNER WILL F INANCE 
LOAN to qualified buyers on 
3 bedroom, 2 bath home, 
storm cellar, and much more. 
Price recently reduced. 
SELLER MOTIVATED. . . 
3 bedroom, central heat/air, 
large yard. Priced to sell. 
COUNTRY HOME w i th  
acreage. Owner will consider 
financing loan. Call for an ap­
pointment.
WEEKEND R E T R E A T
Comfortable two bedroom 
mobile home priced to sell.
2 ACRES PLUS super nice 
mobile home. Edith Estates 
and owner will finance. Call 
today.
EDITH ESTATES, breath­
taking view, double wide, 
ready for occupants. Let's 
deal.
U n i m p r o v e d  l o t  i n
Lakeside Estates priced to 
sell.
Showing FrnHA and HUD 
homes, acreages available. 
Call today.

NEW TO MARKET!
Beautiful 4 bedroom, 2 bath 
home near school. Estab­
lished yard, privacy fence and 
screened-in porch.
MECHANIC GARAGE lo­
cated on 2 lots and fenced. 
GOOD SELECTION of 2
BR, 1 BA, and 3 BR, 2 BA.
3 BR, 2 BA, double 
garage/shop, located on 
corner lots.
2 VACANT LOTS with 2 
Storage bldg., mobile h o m e  
hookups.
SM. HOUSE & 4 lots.
Priced to sell, Bronte.
3 BR, 2 BA with apartment 
located on Iq. corner lot.
SIX BR, 2 BA, located on Ig. 
corner block, near school.
4 BR, 2 BA, barn, 14 Ig. 
pecan trees, creek with 
springs, on approx. 40 acres, 
mobile home on property.
SEVERAL LO TS Edith 
Estates and in Robert Lee.
6 LOTS IN BRONTE on
Hwy. 277. Good commercial 
property.

ADAMS LAND & 
REALTY CO.

Phone 453-2723 or 
655-9429

Elsie Adams 453-2757 
Becky Clendennen 

453-4748

SHAFFER 
FUNERAL HOME
BRONTE ROBERT LEE

473-3131 453-2424
MONUMENTS
Duplications 

^  Custom Designs

FOR SALE -
3 bedroom, 2 bath, 2567 
square foot living area, 650 
square foot unfinished base­
ment & 624 square foot 
garage with patio top located 
at 1417 Childress Street, 
Robert Lee, Texas.

Contact Bill Allen or D'Ann 
Eubanks, Robert Lee State 
Bank, 453-2545. 
_____________20a-tnc

25 ACRES on Hwy 158, 1 
mile from Robert Lee & 1/2 
mile from Lake Spence. 
Agent, 453-2995 or 453- 
2226.
_____________Q2-tnc.

PECAN TREES, fruit trees, 
shade trees. Fresh!! Grown in 
Runnels County and sold at 
wholesale prices. 365-5043. 
________  21b-tnc

GARAGE SALE-weather  
permitting - several families - 
8-5 Sunday, February 3. 305 
W. 13th, Robert Lee, 453- 
4731.
_____________25-1 tc

FOR SALE - 2 bed room  
house, 309 N. Randall. Own­
er will finance. Call 915-378- 
7381.
_____________24b-3tc

A L T E R A T I O N S  - Need 
hems shortened, s leeves 
shortened, or clothes adjust­
ed to recent weight loss or 
gain? Call Jan at 453-2275, 
Robert Lee.
_________  25-ltp

BECOME A PARALE­
GAL, Attorney Instructed, 
Home Study, Establ ished 
1976, FREE Catalog 1-800- 
669-2555, Southern Career 
Institute, P. O. Box 2158, 
Boca Raton, Florida 33427. 
_____________25-3IP

DANCE WITH Y O U R  
S W E E T H E A R T  at the
Valentine Dance at the Robert 
Lee Rec Hall S a tu rday ,  
February 9, 8 pm til midnight, 
sponsored by West Coke 
County Community Develop­
ment. Tickets will be $5 per 
person at the door. 
_____________25-1 tc

c FOR RENT

M. L. S.
LIVESTOCK NUTRITION

Our supplement is a cooked 
molasses base containing 
special enzymes balanced 
with proteins, minerals and vi­
tamins. Comes in its own 
feeder. NO Waste. B&B En­
terprises, 124 North State, 
Bronte, 473-2200. 
_____________19b-tnc

TWO-WAY H A Y - R o u n d  
bales for sale. Wibby Millican, 
453-4609, Robert Lee. 
_____________24:41q

MILLER LIQUID FEED
Now selling my own blend of 
liquid feed supplement - 32% 
protein, $180.00 per ton, de­
livered. James Miller, 473- 
7271.
_____________ 16a-tnc

MOVING SALE - Dell Park­
er's - 1 mile west of Robert 
Lee on Hwy. 158, Saturday, 
February 2, 1991, 9 am to ?. 
Everything from Avon bottles 
to yarn. Please come help me 
clean out my barn. 
_____________24-2tp

ROBERT LEE one bed­
room apartment for rent, $135 
per month. 6 5 5 - 0 3 7 0 ,  
evenings.
_____________21-tnc

THE H O U S I N G  AU­
THORITY of Robert Lee will 
be taking applications for 
housing 9 am - 3 pm, Monday, 
Wednesday, and Friday, 453- 
2912 or 453-2802. Equal 
Housing Opportunity. 
_________ 15a-tnc

FOR RENT - 2 BR house in 
Robert Lee. Call 453-2765 or 
453-4382.
_____________15-tnc

FOR RENT - Small 2 bed­
room house to responsible 
person. Utility room, storage 
and cellar. Available February 
21. Call 473-2075, Bronte, 
after 5 pm.
___________  24b-tnc

thanks to Bro. Epperson, Bro. 
Rogers, and Bro. Arledge.

We love you all.
Jesse and Willie 

_____________ 25-1tP

THANK YOU FOR th e
flowers, cards, visits and es­
pecially the prayers received 
while I was in the hospital. 
Special thanks to Joan Burns, 
Phyllis Cole, Larry Martin and 
other EMS crew members for 
their care and quickness in 
getting me to the hospital.

God bless you all.
June English 

_____________2.5--1IC

c NOTICES D

Foot Problems?
Professional Pedicures 

The Hair C lin ic
Open Thursday & Friday 
will make house calls for 

pedicures any day. 
453-4786

1516 Washington, Robert Lee

J

I CAN GET you top dollar for 
your land for Season Hunting 
Leases, specializing in Game 
Managerhent. If interested, 
call J. R. Newsom, 583-2332, 
Winters.
_____________ 23b-4tP

UTILITY C O M P A N Y  
JOBS. Start $7.80/hr, your 
area. Men and women need­
ed. No experience neces­
sary. For information, call 1- 
900-329-8429, ext. 8301. 6 
am-8pm - 7 days - $12.95 fee. 
_____________25-3tP

Johnson's  
UJater UJeli 

Seruice
Farm

P.anch Home 
Windmills & Pumps 
24 HR. SERVICE

1 - 8 0 0 - 5 4 8 - 4 2 4 1
or

658-6039 655-0379

C M i s e D

GOLD CREDIT CARD
100% approved 

$1,500. credit line 
money back guarantee 
for complete info, call 

1-900-329-0010, $25. fee 
____________23:4lp

ALLBREED

fm a  g iL O o m w a

Now offering dog 
grooming & pet care 

by appointment.
Noel Tinkler 

453-2149 Robert Lee

GOLD CREDIT CARD
100% approved 

$1,500 credit line 
money back guarantee 
for complete info, call 

1-900-329-0010. $25.00 fee.
_____________ 23b-4tP

BE ON TV many needed for 
commercials. Now hiring all 
ages. For casting info, call 
(615) 779-711J Ext. T-268. 
_____________ 24-2tP

f CARD OF THANKS J
DEAR FRIENDS,

Jim and I want to thcTTiK you 
again for your love and con­
cern during my recent hospital 
stay. We greatly appreciate all 
the flowers, cards, calls, food, 
and especially your prayers. 
We ask your continued 
prayers as I continue my ef­
forts to regain my g o o d  
health.

God Bless You, 
Laura Herford 

_____________25.-11P

THANKS FOR ALL th e
calls, flowers, cards, visits, and 
prayers sent our way while 
Jesse was sick. Special

REQUEST FOR BIDS ON 
TEXAS HIGHWAY CON- 

STRUCTION
Sealed proposals for con­

structing 166.381 miles of 
seal coat on various limits on 
US 87, US 67, FM 1221, Fm 
382, US 277, SH 70, SH 29, 
SH 137, FM 2133, RM 385, 
FM 2169, FM 2092, FM 2334, 
FM 2872, RM 2469, and FM 
3399 in Glasscock, Tom 
Green, Runnels, Menard, 
Kimble, Coke and Irion Coun­
ties, covered by CPM 69-2- 
19, CPM 69-6-26, CPM 78-1- 
30, CPM 129-3-7, CPM 129- 
4-5, CPM 158-4-6, CPM 159- 
2-43, CPM 264-4-33, CPM 
264-5-16, CPM 396-1-30, 
CPM 494-7-6, CPM 826-3-7, 
CPM 829-1-19, CPM 2007-1- 
6, CPM 2008-1-13, CPM  
2229-3-5, CPM 2280-1-8, 
CPM 2468-1-10, and CPM 
3378-1-2 will be received a* 
the State Departmen. 
Highways and Pubjic J 
portation, Austin, until 1:00 
pm, February 6, 1991, and 
then publicly opened, ape 
read.

Plans and specifications in­
cluding minimum wage rates 
as provided by Law are avail­
able for inspection at the of­
fice of Evers C. Schmidt Resi­
dent Engineer, Junct ion,  
Texas, and at the State De­
partment of Highways and 
Public Transportation, Austin, 
Texas.

Bidding proposals are to be 
requested from t h e 
Construction Division, D. C. 
Greer State Highway Building, 
11th and Brazos Streets, 
Austin, Texas 78701. Plans 
are available through com­
mercial printers in Austin, 
Texas, at the expense of the 
bidder.

Usual rights reserved.
____________24a-2tc

LEGAL NOTICE 
Selection of County De­

pos ito ry
Notice is hereby given that 

the Commissioner's Court of 
Coke County Texas, will, at its 
regular February Term, 1991, 
select a County Depositor of 
and for the public funds of 
Coke County, Texas, for the 
years 1991 and 1992. Also 
included in the public funds 
are trust funds in the hands of 
the County and District Clerks. 
The applications will conform 
to the provisions of th e  
County Depository Law, Arti­
cles 2544 to 2558A inclusive. 
Revised Civil Statutes of the 
State of Texas; the rules and 
regulations of the Board of 
Governors of the Federal De­
posit Insurance Corporation; 
and the requirements of the 
Coke County Commissioner's 
Court.



classifieds
Any banking corporation, 

association or individual 
banker of Coke County, 
Texas, desiring to be desig­
nated and/or selected as such 
Depository shall make and 
deliver to the County Judge 
of Coke County, Texas, an 
application applying for such 
funds stating the amount of 
paid capital stock and perma­
nent surplus of said bank, to­
gether with a s ta te m en t  
showing the financial condi­
tion of said bank at the date of 
said application, which shall 
be delivered to the County 
Judge of Coke C o u n ty ,  
Texas, on or before 10:00 
o’clock A. M. on the first day of 
regular February Term, 1991, 
of the Commissioner's Court 
of Coke County, Texas, the 
same being on or before 
10:00 o'clock A. M. February 
11, 1991.

Said application shall also 
be accompanied by a certified 
check for not less than one- 
half (1/2) of one per cent (1%) 
of Coke County's revenue for 
the year 1991, as a guarantee 
of the good faith on the part of 
said bank, corporation, or in­
dividual banker, that if said 
bank, association or individual 
banker is accepted and/or 
selected as C o u n t y  
Depository it will enter into the 
bond and/or bonds provided 
therefore by law.

Said application, so filed 
with the County Judge of 
Coke County, Texas, and 
prepared as required by the 
laws of the State of Texas, will 
»-fo eu uy ine com ­
missioner's Court of Coke 
County, Texas at 10 :00  
o'clock A. M., February 11, 
1991, and a County 
Depository selected in accor­
dance with the above referred 
to laws and all other laws of 
the State of Texas covering 
such matters.

Application forms are avail­
able in the office of County 
Judge and shall be used by all 
interested parties. The Com­
missioner’s Court reserves 
the right to reject any and all 
applications received.

STOVER TAYLOR 
COUNTY AUDITOR 

COKE COUNTY, TEXAS

SHERIFF'S SALE 
Abandoned Vehicles
There will be a Sheriff's Sale 

Saturday, March 2, 1991 at 
the Coke County Courthouse 
beginning at 10:00 am.

The abandoned vehicles 
Include:
1. 1973 Olds Cutlass
Supreme
VIN #3J57K3R157432

2. 1980 Buick Skylark 
VIN #4C377AW139824
3. 1964 Ford Galaxy 
VIN #4U62X132006
4. 1980 Jeep Wagoneer 
VIN #J0D17NC027331.

Items may be seen and bid­
ders may pre-register from 
8:00 to 10:00 am the day of 
the sale. Property is to be 
sold as Is. The Sheriff's De­
partment reserves the right to 
refuse any and all bids.

MARSHALL MILLICAN 
COKE COUNTY SHERIFF 

_____________25-5tC

SHERIFF'S SALE 
Seized Vehicles

There will be a Sheriff's Sale 
Saturday, March 2, 1991 at 
the Coke County Courthouse 
beginning at 10:00 am.

The seized vehicles in­
clude:
1. van-type 2-wheel utility 
trailer
2. 1948 Willis Jeep 
S/N #57548
3. 1972 Chevrolet Blazer 
VIN #CKE182F170247
4. Honda ES 6500 generator
5. 1978 Chevrolet 1/2 Ton 
Pickup, 4-wheel drive
VIN #CKL148F441754
6. 1969 Williamscraft Travel 
Trailer, tandem axle.

Items may be seen and bid­
ders may pre-register from 
8:00 to 10:00 am the day of 
the sale. Property is to be 
sold as is. The Sheriff's De­
partment reserves the right to 
refuse any and all bids.

MARSHALL MILLICAN 
COKE COUNTY SHERIFF 

____ ________ 25-5tC

SHERIFF'S SALE
There will be a Sheriff's Sale 

Saturday, March 2, 1991 at 
the Coke County Courthouse 
beginning at 10:00 am. 

items for sale include:
1. 1976 Holiday Rambler 
Travel Trailer
SN #1388699
2. 1977 Dodge Maxi-van
3. ABC Mobile Home 
SN#L8911
4. Olympus VX-404-U Cam­
corder
5. Hand tools
6. Fishing equipment
7. Skiing equipment
8. Water pump
9. Bicycles
10. Chainsaws
11. Guns
12. Tires and many other mis­
cellaneous items.

Items may be seen and bid­
ders may pre-register from 
8:00 to 10:00 am the day of 
the sale. Property is to be 
sold as is. The Sheriff's De­
partment reserves the right to 
refuse any and all bids.

MARSHALL MILLICAN 
COKE COUNTY SHERIFF 

_____________25-5tc
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Effects of Desert Storm seen in county

1040 Department of the Treasury*— Internal Revenue Service

U.S. individual income Tax Return
I OFFICES IN SAN ANGELO & ROBERT LEE

1Ì90

Texas Tax S ervice

APPOINTMENTS 
AVAILABLE 

TO 7 PM

6 DAYS A WEEK 
MON - SAT

INCOME TAX

CONCHO TAX SERVICE
1321 S. OAKES SAN ANGELO. TEXAS 76903 

PHONE 915:658-4213

BOOKKEEPING-NOTARY PUBUC
IF  YOU TAKE A LOAN - YOU MAY HAVE YOUR FEES DEDUCTED FROM YOUR LOAN

ELECTRONIC FILING ‘ "D
AVAILABLE

EDUCTED FROM YOUR L O A N  1

LOAN REFUNDS
-  REFUND ANTiaPATION LOANS ------ '

22 YEARS EXPERIENCE IN TAXES
MEMBER:

NAT’L SOCIETY OF PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS 
NAT’L SOCIETY OF TAX PROFESSIONALS 

C E R T IF IE D  T A X  P R O F E S S IO N A L

WE DO:
STATE

TAX
RETURNS

RANCHERS - FARMERS 
BUSINESSES 
CORPORATIONS 
PARTNERSHIPS

N E W : TAX RETURNS & BOOKKEEPING BY MAIL!
s s a

[Editor's Note: This article is 
reprinted from the Bronte 
High School paper. T he  
Longhorn Express.]

Desert Storm Strikes 
Close To Home 

[Express Editor's Note: As 
the war in the Persian Gulf 
unfolds, thousands of con­
cerned Americans watch, wait, 
and worry. Bronte Senior An­
gela Davis (nee Reyes) has an 
even more personal stake in 
the crisis, as her husband Tim 
is now on his way to Saudi 
Arabia. Angela shares her 
feelings and experiences 
from the last month concern­
ing the war.]

My kindergarten days were 
spent playing with the red 
blocks, singing songs, and 
wondering when It would be 
time to go to the playground.

From elementary into high 
school, my only real responsi­
bility was school. I occasion­
ally wondered what I would be 
when I grew up and often 
thought of being an athletic 
star. That was indeed the 
sweet life. The life so many 
young people take for grant­
ed.

I never dreamed of being 
married my senior year, re­
ceiving a marriage certificate 
before my high school diplo­
ma. I also never dreamed of 
the possibility of a world war 
with my husband facing the 
fear of the front line.

However, all this has be­
come a reality in just a few 
short weeks. Tim received his 
orders to leave for Saudi Jan­
uary 4. We had only 17 days 
left, so with the help of family 
and friends we quickly mar­
ried.

At Ft. Hood in Killeen, Tim 
got word that he would not be 
leaving and instead would 
serve on funeral detail. I came 
home thinking everything was 
going to be all right. A couple 
of weeks later, Tim called to 
tell me that his funeral detail 
orders were cancelled and he 
would be leaving after all.
S te e r J V 's  p lac e
f irs t  at M e rtzo n

The Steer JV team travelled 
to Mertzon for the Irion Coun­
ty JV Tourney January 24 and 
26 and came home with the 
1st Place Trophy.

In the Steers' first game, 
Robert Lee beat Bronte, 37- 
21. Joe Blair put in 18 to take 
high-point honors. A lso  

/co ring  were Russ Horn 7, 
Todd Scott 4, John Williams 3, 
Thad Metcalf and Dean Burns 
2 each, and William Aldridge 
1 .

In the second game, the 
Steers came away with a 49- 
36 win over Irion County. 
Todd Scott was high-point 
with 18, followed by John 
Williams with 13, Joe Blair 8, 
Judd Pitcock 4, and Brent 
Jameson, Thad Metcalf, and 
Jason Dickey with 2 points 
apiece.

In the last game, Robert Lee 
trampled Menard 62-24 to 
clinch the first place spot. 
John Williams and Joe Blair 
both scored in double figures 
with 16 and 12. Also con­
tributing to the win were Thad 
Metcalf 7, Todd Scott and 
William Aldridge 6 each. Dean 
Burns 5, Brent Jameson and 
Russ Horn 3 each, and Jason 
Dickey and Judd Pitcock 2 
each.

The pain I share with thou­
sands of people is hard to ex­
plain. One cannot begin to 
realize the seriousness of war 
and all the many happenings 
that surround it until someone 
you love Is in the middle of it 
all.

Tim joined the army for 
many reasons. He and I both 
knew we would be married 
someday and he felt the best 
way he could support me was 
through the army. Now, with 
the recent turn of events, he 
is in a situation where his life is 
at risk. Tim explained to me 
he would be fighting for his 
country, the freedom of 
Kuwait, the protection of his 
friends, and the people he 
dearly loves.

As he prepared last week to 
leave for the Persian Gulf, the 
seriousness of the matter be­
came apparent. Life at Ft. 
Hood was full of panic. Tim, 
along with other deploying 
soldiers, spent most of the 
time at the dentist's office 
having his teeth fixed and at 
the clinic getting the required 
shots needed before ship­
ping overseas.

Most of the parking lots and 
buildjngs at Ft. Hood were 
blockaded because of nu­
merous bomb threats re­
ceived. It was hard not to no­
tice the parking lots full of cars

left behind by the soldiers al­
ready in Saudi Arabia. People 
were busy shipping their be­
longings back home and 
cleaning their barracks for new 
incoming recruits.

I often took long looks at 
Tim hoping to remember his 
face deep in my mind. He 
would ask why I stared at him, 
but 1 could not tell him the 
reasons for my staring as I 
tried to make the most of our 
last week together.

It was not as easy as I 
thought It would be, though I 
feel very much satisfied with 
the time spent with him. We 
left each other with our hearts 
strong and full of spirit. He 
told me I was his right hand 
and that he would come home 
soon to live our lives in peace.

Tim left early Sunday morn­
ing for Ft. Knox in Kentucky, 
where he would receive his 
desert equipment and endure 
another dreadful trip Into the 
gas chambers.

He deploys today for Saudi 
Arabia, a country halfway 
across the world, on a 23 hour 
flight.

All I can do now is support 
and pray for the men and 
women who are serving in 
Operation Desert Storm and I 
leave Tim in God's precious 
hands where I truly know he 
will be safest.

Blackwell Honor Roll
Blackwell CISD has 

announced the honor rolls for 
the 3rd Six Weeks.

"A"
1st Grade

Will Blaine 
Cody Blair 
Mindy Boyd 
Jennifer Cooper 
Maria Mendez 
Justin Logan

2nd Grade 
Ricky Wilson 
Clint Morgan 
Ashley Ragland 
Katy Driver 
Steven Hayes 
Shannon VanVIeck 

3rd Grade 
Jennifer Boyd 
Leticia Camarillo 
Leman Saunders 
Adam Wilkinson 
Lindsey Hamilton 

5t.h Grade 
Elizabeth Camarillo 
Kallie Lisso 
Jimmy Loveday

gth Grade
Brandon Boyd

8th Grade 
Danyelle Rideout 
Cody Wilkinson

9th Grade 
Cyndi Carlton 
Roseann Yarbrough 

10th Grade 
Stepheny Baucom 
Christy Williams

11th Grade 
Trade Hindman

12th Grade 
D'Linn Blair 
Dianna Edwards 
Stacy Hyde 
Christina Meffert 
Marla Self

"A-B"
1st Grade 

Larry Carter 
Kammie Lisso 
Codi Monsey 
Tara Sarratt 
Jena Weatherwax 
Timothy Wood

2nd Grade 
Gayna Cantrell 
Viola Sims 
Matthew Jones 
LaTosha Roland 
Ben Blaine

3rd Grade 
Stephanie Cantrell 
Gloria Solis

4th Grade 
Jimmy Holland 
Chayne Roland

5ih,..Grade 
Mauricio Chavez 
Chris Haas 
Joanie Ussery

6th Grade 
Chrissy Allen 
Nathan Hayes 
Brandy Hoyle 
Judith Taylor 
Jerry Watts

7th Grade 
Sonia Chavez 
Kye Lamm

8th Grade 
Jacob Blair 
Jason Murphy 
Carrie Parsons 
Connie Sawyer 
Todd Smith 
Karen Taylor 
Prentice Westbrook 
Kelly Wilcox

9th Grade 
Scott Hirtzel 
Shane Meffert 
Tracy Smedley

10th Grade 
Royce Jennings 
Joey O'Malley

11th Grade 
Tricia Allen 
Jody Bell 
Chance Lamm

12th Grade 
Tammy Barnes 
Julie Byers 
Jimmy Waddington 
Jennifer Hejl 
Billy Hindman 
Beth Holland 
Amber Waddington 
Will Davis 
Tim Neal
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Exhibiting the 1991 reserve champion breed­
ing ram was Christie Payne.

Juiie Biair displays the reserve grand champi­
on market hog of the 1991 county stock show.

Br. FCA plans activities
by Kristie Cooper

Fellowship of Christian 
Athletes members met Mon­
day night, January 21, for a 
small business meeting and to 
discuss future activities.

Recently, FCA members 
have been giving delicious 
cakes and cookies away to 
lucky winners at home varsity 
basketball games. The do­
nated money has gone to the 
FCA treasury for club ex­
penses.
LOOK WHO'S NEW!
Sarah Kay Gandy
Pam and Eddie W ayne 

Gandy of San Angelo are the 
proud new parents of Sarah 
Kay Gandy. She was born at 
Angelo Community Hospital in 
San Angelo January 24, 
1991, at 10:42 am. She 
weighed in at 7 lbs., 3 oz.

Sarah is also welcomed by 
her 5 year old brother, Aaron, 
and her g r a n d m o th e r s ,  
Bessie Brice of Robert Lee 
and Doris Gandy of San An­
gelo.

2nd Inf. search
The Second (Indian Head) 

Division Association is cur­
rently conducting a nation­
wide search for anyone (Male 
or Female) who ever served in 
the Second Infantry Division.

A 70th annual reunion is 
planned for July 17-20 1991 
In Omaha Neb. For additional 
information about the reunion 
and the Association contact 
the National Secretary, Bill 
Creech, P. O. Box 460, Buda, 
Texas 78610.

M

M

N

After the business meeting, 
Mrs. Keith (Vicky) McCutchen 
gave a lesson on self-esteem. 
The program showed how 
God intertwines your negative 
characteristics and your posi­
tive ones together with his 
love.

At the remaining home bas­
ketball games, the members 
have decided to raise the 
American flag while playing 
the National Anthem. At this 
time, basketball players and 
FCA members shall be on the 
court, honoring those men 
and women that are serving 
our country overseas. A mo­
ment of silence and prayer will 
also be observed at this time.

If you have any questions, 
please contact Kristie Cooper 
or Mrs. McCutchen.

Local reps attend 
TEHA training

Virginia Boatright, TEHA 
Coke County Chairman, and 
Zera Fields, Vice Chairman, 
attended the Texas Exten­
sion Homemakers Association 
training meeting held in Run­
nels County. Fifty-seven 
TEHA members from District 7 
also attended this meeting.

Plans were made for the 
upcoming district and state 
TEHA meetings. The after­
noon session consisted of 
general business, meeting 
producers, credential report, 
and family community leader­
ship update. The meeting 
ended with the members re­
viewing the state recommen­
dations.

M

M

M
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Extra Lean lb.

$2.49
lb. $1.69

$1.39
$1.79

$2.39
$1.65Asst.

Flavors

Boneless Top
SIRLOIN STEAK lb

N

Home Made Pure Pork Sausage 
Pork Shoulder
ROAST LB

Gooch Blue Ribbon Bacon 1# Pkg.
Boneless Top
ROUND STEAK

Betty Crocker Hamburger Helper 
Parade Vegetable Cooking

SPRAY 6 oz. can $1.49
Parade Long grain Rice 2# Bag 63c
Hormel Vienna Sausage 5 oz. can 67c
Parade
COFFEE 13 oz. can $1.59

Parade Coffee Filters 100 ct. pkg. 53c 
Sugary Sam Cut Sweet Potatoes 17 oz. can 69c 
Parade Red Plum Jam 18 oz. glass $1.09 
Chicken of the Sea Green Label

TUNA 6 oz. can -

COCA-COLA $1.69
Parade Fabric Softener Sheets 20 ct. box 79c 
Parade Bathroom
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TISSUE
Hi-Dri Towels 
Earthtone Napkins

4 roll pkg. 89c
63c

300 Ct. pkg. $1.99

16 oz. btl.
98 OZ. family size

42 oz. btl.

$1.35
$6.99

$2.79
8 oz. crt. 99c

Shampoo or Conditioner
WHITE RAIN 
ULTRA TIDE

Dawn Dish Soap 
Birdseye Cool Whip
Parade Sliced Strawberries 10 oz. crt. 73c 
Totinos Party
PIZZA 10.2 oz. size $1.29

Prices Good Thursday, Jan. 31st 
through Wednesday, Feb. 6th.

M

: BAKER'S GRO. & MKT.
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