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West Texas Utilities Company 
Forms New District

The organization of a new oj>erat- 
ing district of the West Texas Util­
ities Company was announced to­
day by Cal Young, WTU president.

The new operating district will be 
known as the Panhandle District. 
It was formed by combining the 
Quanah and Childress Districts. J. 
C. Randel, manager of the Quanah 
District and acting manager of the 
Childress District, has been named 
manager of the new district.

Randel, who has been manager 
of the Quanah District since 1956, 
assumed supervision of both dis­
tricts in December of last year fol­
lowing the death of Allen Shahan, 
manager of the Childress District.

The new district will be the Com­
pany’s third largest, comparable 
in size to the Abilene and San An­
gelo Districts.

'The district office, which will be 
located in Childress, will be almost 
in the exact center of the Panhan­
dle District. The district will extend 
approximately 60 miles in each di­
rection : from Vernon on the east to 
Quitaque on the west, from Sham­
rock on the north to Paducah and 
Matador on the south.

Young emprasized that only the 
two district offices were involved. 
He pointed out that in no event 
would x>ersonnel in the district of­
fices concerned lose seniority or be 
released.

“In our continuing efforts to hold 
el,’’ Young said, “it is necessary 
electric rates to our pre-WWII lev- 
that we take eveiy step, such as 
the creation of this new district, to 
cut our operating costs, reduce our 
overhead and to improve our oper­
ating efficiency.”

Randel, in speaking of his new 
assignment said, “The opportunity 
of operating one of the Company’s 
largest districts presents a wonder­
ful challenge which I welcome.” 

“Today, when every economy of 
jperation is necessary to keep our 
lost of service low to our custom- 
r,” Randel pointed out, “it is just 
t practical to maintain two dis- 

organizations only thirty miles 
rt.”
h  1927, when the old Quanah 
Childress Districts were estab- 

:'d,’’ Randel said, “I do not re- 
there being a paved highway 

}; ,1 .? a^ea and our communica­
tions, ouch as were available at 
the time, pretfr well limited us to 
a small operating area.”

“Today, the situation is entirely 
different. With the excellent net­
work pf paved highways crossing 
the territory east to west and north 
to souith, and with he convenience

of modern telephone and two-way 
radio communication, we have 
found that district personnel can be 
responsible for and supervise larg­
er areas.”

“Another factor enters into this 
new development,” Randel continu­
ed. “The areas of the two districts 
are very similar ; the economies are 
closely related; and together they 
make a logical working unit for our 
operation.”

“We believe that the future of 
the new Panhandle District holds 
great promise. With the wonderful 
ranch and farm lands providing the 
basis for a balanced agricultural 
economy ; with the expansion of oil 
production and with the progress­
ive community spirit of the people, 
I know we will be able to assist sub­
stantially in the development of the 
area included in the Panhandle 
District.”

“Particularly with the various 
groups in the district working to 
solve the problem of adequate wa­
ter supplies and to create a favor­
able climate for industrial expan­
sion, it will be our purpose to work 
for tbe fullest industrial develop­
ment of the area.”

In commenting on his plans, Ran­
del said, “Certainly it will take 
some time to completely merge the 
operations and personnel of the two 
district offices. Mrs. Randel and! I 
plan to move to Childress; howev­
er, we have to first dispose of our 
home in Quanah and make arrange­
ments for a new home in Chil­
dress.”

The new District Manager is a 
veteran WTU employee, having 
been with the Company 34 years # 
most of which has been in the new 
Panhandle District area. In 1949, 
Randel was named Assistant Dis­
trict Manager and assigned to Ver­
non. He was promoted to District 
Manager, with headquarters in 
Quanah, in 1956.

A veteran of WWH; Randel has 
been active in the American Leg­
ion and Veteran of Foreign Wars. 
He also is a member of the Quanah 
Rotary Club and in the towns 
where he has served, his record a  ̂
a civic worker and a Chamber of 
Commerce booster has been out­
standing. Randel has served as a 
director of the Vernon, Quanah and 
West Texas Chambers of Com­
merce.

An Elder of the Presbyterian 
Church in Quanah, Randel is also 
an active member of the Masonic 
Lodge. He and Mrs. Randel have 
one daughter, Mrs. Don Haynes of 
ChiUicothe, Texas.

Panthers Win Bi-district
The Quitaque Panthers shot their 

way into the Bi-Distrirt champion­
ship and advanced to the Regional 
Tournament last Monday night by 
taking a two-point 47-45 win over 
the McAdoo Eagles before a large 
crowd in the Plainview High School 
Gym.

The game was close all the way, 
with six points being the widest 
margin held by either team, that 
held briefly by the Panthers in 
the third quarter. McAdoo had a 
five point lead at one time in the 
first period. It was of short dur­
ation. The lead changed hands ten 
times during the game and was 
tied 7 times

James Starkey popped the nets 
with one of his pretty shots from 
the side to open game scoring and 
the Eagles’ McWilliams promptly 
tied it up and then Powers sent 
McAdoo ahead with a lay up. 'The 
count was tied again at 7-7, and 
then McAdoo built up their 12-7 
lead before the Panthers pulled 
up at 11-12 at the end of the first 
period.

The second quarter was more of 
the same with botn team trading 
point for point and McAdoo still 
owned a one-point 26-25 lead at 
half time. During the third peroid 
the Panthers outscored the, Eagles 
11-6 and at one point it began to 
look like the Quitaque lads were 
finally off and running and they 
had a 36-32 lead at the end of the 
3rd quarter but four of the Pan­
thers Were playing with four fouls 
each against them and had to 
play it a bit cautious. They were 
outscored 14-11 in the final frarne 
but did manage to outlast the

Eagles. McAdoo had a chance to 
tie the game in the fading seconds 
when Larry Morris, the games’ top 
scorer for the night missed a shot 
from about the free throw line.

The game was just as close as 
the score indicated in every re­
spect. Each team made 11 free 
throws and the Panthers made 18 
field goals to the Eagles 17. The 
Panthers had 18 fouls called on 
them and McAdoo 14.

The Panthers played their top 
defensive game of the year. This 
was where McAdoo expected to 
win, for they had scouted the Pan­
thers twice this season and it hap­
pened that they caught Quitaque 
when they were having two of their 
most miserable' nights defensively. 
Most Quitaque fans felt that had 
the Panthers been hitting with any­
thing like their usual accuracy, 
the game would not have been 
close. Tills observer felt that the 
Quitaque lads should have won by 
at least 15 points.

Sammy Johnston led the Panther 
scoring with 15 points. James Star- 
key was next withi 11, followed by 
Dellis Monk who canned 10 points, 
Phelps 7 and Jack Johnson made 
4 points, a well balanced scoring 
attack. McAdoo’s Larry Morris hit 
for 21 iwints to win scoring honors 
for the night and teammate John 
Powers dropped in 15. BiU McWil­
liams made 7 points and John Mc­
Cormick managed for 2 points to 
round out the scoring for the 
Eagles. McAdoo has a real fine 
team but they are just not as good 
as the tall Panthers.

The greater portion of Quita­
que’s population was on hand to

see the game Monday night, along 
with basketball fans from all over 
the area. It was the largest crowd 
the Panthers had ever performed 
before and they put on a good 
show.

Friday evening at 7 o’clock in 
the West Texas State Field House 
at Canyon, the Panthers will try to 
continue their winning ways and 
their goal now is the coveted trip 
to Austin to play in the State 
Championship Tournament, t h e  
dream of every schoolboy who 
plays basketball. Quitaques oppo­
nent Friday night wjll be Flower 
Grove, a school near Lamesa. We 
have been unable to find out any­
thing about their team, their re­
cord or who they have played. 
They did not have to play a bi­
district game, advancing to Region­
al via a ibye.

The Panthers will be one of the 
favorites to capture the regional 
tourney, on the strength of their 
record, and the ease with which 
they have beaten many of their 
opponents.

Another well-rated team that will 
play in the tourney is Megargel, a 
school located near Seymour. They 
boast a fine 34-2 season record 
and they took a lop-sided 69-36 win 
over O’Brien in a bi-district game 
Tuesday night. If the Panthers 
make their way into the finals at 
Canyon, there is a good chance that 
they will meet the Megargel Mus­
tangs.

Monday nights win over McAdoo 
brought the Panthers’ season re­
cord to 30 wins and 3 losses. Last 
Thursday night in the West Texas 
State Field House the Panthers lost

a close 61-58 game to the San Jon 
Coyotes, who are defending Qass 
B champions of New Mexico and 
are prime candidates to repeat. 
The Coyotes are a smooth, classy 
basketball team. They threatened 
to turn the game into a rout Thurs­
day night building up a 13 point 
halftime lead, but the Panthers 
came roaring back in the second 
half, went ahead with two and a 
half minutes left in the game but 
couldn’t hold their lead and drop­
ped a heartbreaker to a very fine 
team.

Elsewhere in this issue of the 
Tribune, merchants and friends oí 
this year’s fine Panther team of­
fer their congratulations for win­
ning bi-district and best wishes at 
Regional. Most of them have said 
that they are closing up shop at 
five o’clock Friday and will be 
on hand at Canyon come game 
time to root for them. Most fans 
here feel that this might be the 
year for a Quitaque team, to go to 
Austin.

------- o-------
Here is the schedule for the Reg­

ional Tournament at Canyon this 
weekend.

Briscoe will open the tournament 
against Booker at 3 o’clock Friday 
afternoon.

Megargel plays Pep at 4:15, Qui­
taque plays Flower Grove at 7 o’­
clock and at 8:15 Adrian will play 
Roosevelt.

The winners will play at 10 and 
11:15 A.M. Saturday. Tbs Saturday 
morning losers will play for third 
place at 7 P.M. and the Saturday 
morning winners will play for the 
regional championship at 8 :15 P.M

Service Held For 
Willie E. Lyles

Funeral services for Willie Ed­
gar Lyles, 67, of Turkey were held 
Tuesday afternoon at 2:30 in the 
Church of Christ at Turkey with 
Jack Hutton, minister, officiating, 
assisted by Earl Cantwell, min­
ister from Silverton.

Burial was in Dreamland Ceme­
tery at Turkey under the direction 
of Eudy-Seale Funeral Home.

Dallbearers were Doc Connors, 
Buster Hanna, Will Corgill, Paul 
Geissler, Bill Mullin and J. V. 
Young.

Honorary paUbearers were Rob­
ert Proctor, Richabd Hill, Jess Mul­
lin, Jess Johnson, Leon Lane and 
Ewald Geissler.

Mr. Lyles died Monday morning 
in Stanley Hospital at Matador.

He was bom December 3, 1894, 
in Indian Territory, and moved to 
this area 65 years ago. He was 
married to Miss Nettie Jane Stew­
art on July 25, 1916, in Turkey.

He is survived by his wife, of the 
home; three daughters, Mrs. Boyd 
Lane, Mrs Clyde Johnson, both of 
Turkey, and Mrs. Doyle Calvert of 
Flomot; five sons, Euman, Billy 
and Eldon, all of Turkey, Bernard 
of Quitaque, and Travis of Pampa; 
18 grandchildren and two great­
grandchildren.

MEMPHIS PRODUCTION CREDIT 
ASSOCIATION TO HAVE 
STOCKHOLDERS MEETING
You are hereby officially notified 

that the Twenty - Eighth Annual 
Meeting of the Stockholders of the 
Memphis Production Credit Associa­
tion will be held on Friday, March 
2, 1962, in the City Auditorium at 
Childress, Texas. Registration of 
stockholders and guests wiU begin 
at 9 A.M.. We urge everyone to try 
to be on hand when the meeting is 
called to order at 10:15 A.M. as too 
many late arrivals distract from 
the meeting.

^  S SURGERY
Mrs. Jack Meeks, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. B. K. Hamilton un­
derwent major surgery at a Fort 
Worth hospital Monday morning. 
Her husband called her parents 
Monday night and reported that 
she had withstood the surgery in 
good fashion and was resting at the 
time.

Those wishing to send a card 
can mail it to Mrs. Margaret 
Teeks, Room 515, AU Saints Hos-

;al. Fort Worth, Texas.
------- o-------

4STER BARBER WAYNE
7ayne Martin went to Dallas, 
iday, Feb. 12, where he took 
examination for his Master 
xer’s License, which exam- 
m he jxassed wiith flying colors.

Lions Club Sponsor 
Of 42 Party

'The Quitaque Lions Club is spon­
soring a 42 Party at the school 
lunch room next Tuesday night, 
February 27, starting at 7 o’clock.

Members of the Lions Club are 
selling tickets to the party. An 
evening of fun is in store for all 
who attend. In addition to the 42 
games, cakes will be auctioned off.

Refreshments will be served and 
prizes will be awarded to the coup­
le winning the most games.

’The Lions Club is still trying to 
raise some much needed cash and 
this is one way in which they are 
going about it.

You are assured a night of fun 
in addition to helping out the Lions 
by attending the party.

The Lions fed the Panthers at 
the meeting last Monday night.

Mrs. Geo. H, Currie 
Buried Monday

Funeral services for Mrs. Geo. 
H. Currie, area resident since 1907, 
were held Monday afternoon at 
2:30 in the First Baptist Church 
at Turkey.

Officiating was the Rev. Dale 
Bryant, pastor of the Holt Baptist 
Church. He was assisted by the 
Rev. Vergil Smith, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church at Turkey. 
Burial was in the Quitaque Ceme­
tery under the direction of Eudy- 
Seale Funeral Home of Turkey.

Pallbearers were Tom Pierce, 
Scott Bolton, Otho Stubbs, Jack 'Ty­
ler, Algie Turner and Floyd Gil­
more.

Honorary pallbearers were Irl 
Twila, Roy Russell, Jess Meach- 
am, Sam Mayes, G. O. Coker and 
Bert Degan.

Mrs. Currie died Sunday, Feb. 
18, at 7 :03 A. M. at a rest home in 
Clarendon. She was 84.

Patience Wyatt Currie was born 
April 16, 1877, in Lampasas, and 
was married Nov. 4, 1894, in Gon­
zalez to George Henry Currie. He 
died April 21, 1955.

She is survived by two daugh­
ters, Irene Jester of Bradley, Ark., 
and Mrs. Susie Van Winkle of Am­
arillo; six sons, Herbert of Little­
field, Jim of Amarillo, and Ellis, 
John, Will and Albert, all of Tur­
key; 10 grandchildren and 10 great­
grandchildren.

Mr. and Mrs. Mort Hawkins vis­
ited Mrs. J. H. Simmons in the 
Crum Nursing Home at Lockney 
Friday night. They also visited 
Frank Hawkins at Lockney Gen­
eral Hospital. Frank entered the 
Hospital Thursday and was put 
in traction for a back injury.

------- o-------
Mr. and Mrs. Billie Joe Sachse 

and baby of Amarillo visited his 
grandmother, Mrs. F. M. Sachse 
Saturday.

Mrs. O. V. Johnson returned to 
here home early this week from 
Matador where she had been in the 
hospital for the past two weeks. 
Mr. Johnson reported that she is 
improved some, but still is not feel­
ing very well.

Mr. and Mrs. E. T. Lyons of 
Truth or Consequences, N. M. are 
staying in the home of Mrs. J. H. 
Simmons are are helping to care 
for Mrs. Simmons while she is 
in Crum Nursing Home at Lock­
ney. Mrs. Lyons is the former 
Bess Simmons.

MRS. JAMES REED SUFFERS 
SEVERE BURNS ON ARM

Mrs James Reed suffered serious 
and very painful burns on her left 
arm in an accident at her home 
Monday.

She reported that she was render­
ing lard in the kitchen of the Reed 
home southeast of Quitaque when 
she spilled a cup of the hot grease 
on her arm.

To make matters worse, she suf­
fered a reaction to a tetanus shot 
Tuesday, and said she was “all 
swelled up” from that but was re­
covering from that and her burns 
were healing also.

AHENDS OES FRIENDSHIP 
NIGHT AT LITTLEFIELD

Mrs John Rogers, accompanied 
by Mrs. Dimple McGavock of 
Lockney, spent Thursday night in 
Littlefield. Mrs. Rogers was guest 
of her sister, Mrs. Weldon Findley 
and family, and Mrs. McGavcxck 
was guest at the home of a friend, 
Mrs. Farquay and her family.

The ladies attended an Eastern 
Star meeting in the Masonic Hall 
there, the occasion being “Friend­
ship Night” . A large crowd attend­
ed the meeting from Chapters in 
towns from all over this part of 
West Texas.

The program was presented by 
entertainers from Lubbock. Mrs. 
Findley led the group gathered in 
the Hall, which was decorated in 
a Western and Indian theme for 
the occasion, in appropriate songs, 
Mr. and Mrs. Findley are Worthy 
Matron and Worthy Patron of the 
Littlefield Chapter.

After the program, a salad sup­
per was served the guests.

-------o-------
Mrs. E. A. Puckett returned 

home Friday after a ten day visit 
in Tulsa, Okla. with Mr. and Mrs. 
Weldon Griffin. Mrs. Griffin and 
baby returned to Quitaque with 
Mrs. Puckett for a visit with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Woods 
and with Weldon’s parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Griffin.

CUB PACK MEETING 
NEXT TUESDAY NIGHT

Tuesday night, February 27th, is 
the regular time for the Cub Pack 
Meeting. It will be at 7 o’clock in 
Fellowship HaU of First Methodist 
Church. All parents are urged to 
attend

ATTENDS FUNERAL OF UNCLE
G. R. Hollis, 8l, of Broadview, 

N. M., Uncle of Mrs. D. C. Duck, 
died Saturday night, February 17, 
in a Clovis hospital. Mrs. Duck, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bert Degan of Turkey 
and Mr. and Mrs. Joe Degan of 
Flomot drove to Clovis Sunday and 
returned that night. Funeral ser­
vices for Mr. Hollis were held at 
2 o’clock Tuesday afternoon in the 
First Baptist Church at Grady, N. 
M. and burial was in the Grady 
Cemetei^.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Degan, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bert Degan, Mrs. D. C. 
Duck, Mrs. A. B. Ramsey, Jr. and 
Mrs. H. G Boyles of Silverton .at­
tended the funeral services.

Mr and Mrs. Charles Rowell of 
Silverton spent Sunday with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. P. John 
Monk and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Corky Davis and 
son of Amarillo spent Friday with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Lori 
McKay and family. Corky returned 
to Amarillo and Mrs. Davis and 
son remained here until Sunday, 
when Corky came back to return 
them to their home in Amarillo.

Mrs. Everett Boyles spent Sun­
day with her daughter, Mrs. Dud 
Watters and Carol in Silverton.

Mrs. Mary Pittman and Mr. C. 
T. Rucker visited Mr. Rucker’s 
sister, Mrs. Frances McElhannon 
at Lubbock last Tuesday. They re­
port that her physical condition is 
much improved,

Johnny Powell, local West Texas 
Utilities manager, attended a meet­
ing of WTU managers at Abilene 
last Saturday and on Monday atten­
ded another meeting at Childress. 

-------o-------
Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Finney spent 

Saturday in Amarillo with their 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Ronald 
Kaiser and family. They returned 
to Quitaque Saturday evening, but 
were called back to Amarillo Sun­
day due to illness in the Kaiser’s 
family.

Rice Dry Goods 
Suffers Light 
Fire Damage

Fire broke out in the store room 
in the rear of Rice Dry Goods 
about 12:30 P. M. last Friday but 
early discovery of the blaze and 
quick work on the part of the Fire 
Department resulted in the fire be­
ing doused before very much dam 
age was sustained.

Owner Pete had gone home for 
lunch about ten minutes before 
the fire was discovered. Mrs. John 
King was on duty at the store 
when smoke was sighted pouring 
in from the ceiling at the rear of 
the building. They summoned the 
fire department and called Pete, 
and the flames were doused in a 
matter of a few minutes.

Cause of the fire is not known.
Summer hats and other items 

stored in the back room were the 
principal items lost. Some wall 
and ceiling damage weS sustaim 
at the rear of the building.

Pete reported that he did not get 
very excited until everything was 
all over, then the reaction hit, 
when he thought of how sefious 
it could have been.

Mrs. F. M. Sachse and Letha 
Mae Jacobs were Turkey visitors 
Tuesday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Odell Setliff and 
boys of Turkey spent S u n d a y with 
the Ralph Carters, Odell spoke at 
the Church of Christ here Sunday.

Mrs. Jean Grundy and Mrs. 
Reed Bethel of Lamesa returned 
their father, N. L. Bedwelt to his 
home here Sunday after a week’s 
visit with them at Lamesa,

Mr. and Mrs. Bud Bailey and 
girls visited Mrs. Bailey’s parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. T. J. Reeves in  
Plainview Sunday.

J. J. McKay of Amarillo and 
Dud Watters of Silverton visited 
their father-in-law, Everett Boyles 
Sunday. Mr. Boyles has been iU 
with the flu.

------- o-------
Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Campbell of 

Amarillo spent last week-end with 
their daughter, Mrs. Odis Reagan 
and family. Mrs Campbell remain­
ed until Tuesday and Mrs. Reagan 
returned her to her home.

Briscoe County 
Farmers Union To 
HíeetAí Gasoline

The Briscoe County Farmers 
Union will meet Monday night, 
February 26, at 7:30 P. M. in the 
Gasoline Community Building.

Texas Farmers Union president 
J. I. Ñaman of Waco, Texas will 
be the Special Speaker for the even­
ing.

Also on the program for the 
evening will be a report by the 
Washington Bus-Trippers.

Refreshments will be furnished 
by the Gasoline Farmers Union.

The public is invited to attend.

FARMER'S UNION PRESIDENT 
TO SPEAK AT GASOLINE

Jay Ñaman

State president of Texas Farm­
ers Union, Jay Ñaman of Waco, 
will address a series of meetings 
of Farmers Union throughout the 
South, South Central and North 
Plains area during the week of 
February 26 through March 2. His 
itinerary will be as follows :

Mon., Feb. 26 7:30 P. M. Com­
munity Building, Gasoline 

Tues., Feb. 27 6:30 A. M. Break­
fast Wayne’s Restaurant at 
Tulia.

Tues., Feb. 27 7:30 P. M. Com­
munity Building, Hereford 

Wed., Feb. 28 7:00 A. M. Break­
fast, Steak House at Dimmitt 

Thurs., Mar. 1 7 :00 A. M. Break­
fast at Chat ‘N Chew Res­
taurant, Levelland 

'Thurs., Mar. 1 7:30 P. M. Court 
House Auditorium, Lamesa 

President Ñaman states that his 
purpose in making this tour is to 
emphasize the importance to all of 
the leadership and members of 
Farmers Union in West Texas the 
proposed long-range farm program 

(Continued On Back Page)
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Mr. Albert Smith of Turkey spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. W. J. 
Carter.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Ramsey and 
boys spent Sunday afternoon in 
Turkey with her sister, Mrs. Jan 
Turner and Mr Turner.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Persons visit­
ed Mr. and Mrs. W. E. Schott and 
family in Silverton Sunday even­
ing. Rena and W. E. had just re­
turned from a visit in the Valley. 
They flew to McAllen Friday where 
visited Christine Ballinger and her 
family. She is the former Christine 
Bundy. The Schotts returned to 
Silverton Sunday afternoon.

------- o-------
The Rev and Mrs. Dallas Roark 

and Lyman of Plainview spent Sun­
day with Mr. and Mrs. Gaston 
Owens and Eddie.

Mr. and Mrs. C. E. Anderson, 
Jr. and children, and a little friend 
of Kay’s, of Tulia and Mr. and 
Mrs. Alton Anderson and family 
of Flomot spent Sunday with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. E. An­
derson, Sr.-

------- o-------
Mr. and Mrs. Vance Robison 

took their daughter, Vanessa to 
Memphis for medical attention Sun­
day morning. Vanessa has been suf­
fering with an ear infection.

------- 0-------
Guests of Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 

Davidson and Mrs. Estelle David­
son for the weekend 
D avison arid roommate from West 
•Texas State; Mrs. Estelle David 
son’s sister, Mrs. N. A. Shackle­
ford, Dan and Vada from Amarillo 
and Jo Beth and Ronnie McCrack­
en from Tulia.

Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Ewing were 
in Plainview Wednesday, Thurs­
day and Friday of last week while 
Mrs. Ewing was under consulta­
tion of the doctor. They were also 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Gregg.

------- 0-------
Mrs. A. C. Barrett went to Sil­

verton Friday to get her grand­
children, Susie and Jim Seaney, 
who were visiting their grandpar­
ents there, the George Seaney’s. 
They remained with the Barretts 
until Sunday evening.

------- o-------
Mrs. Ted Hester of Silverton 

spent Saturday with her sister, 
Mrs. Odell Johnston.

---------0--------
Mrs. Odell Johnston visited her 

parents, Mr. and Mrs. G. H. 'Thom­
as in Silverton Sunday.

------- o-------
Mr and Mrs. Donnie Perkins of 

Silverton are the proud parents of 
a baby girl, bom Saturday morn­
ing in the Tulia Hospital. She 
weighed 8 lbs., 12 ozs., and has 
been namd Patty LeAnne. Her 
mother is the former Sandra 
Smith, and she is the niece of Mrs. 
Odell Johnston.

OES HOSTs T P "
42 TOURNAMENT

The Quitaque Chapter of t h e  
OES were sponsors of a 42 Tour­
nament which was held in the Bank 
Community Room last Friday 
night. __ _

Outrof-to5wfi present were
Mr. and Mrs. A1 Wilson and Mr. 
and Mrs. Woodward from Plain- 
view i Mrs. W. N. Weatberwax and 
Carol Hamilton from Amarillo, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Rayford Hewett of 
Lubbock. Local members and 
guests present for a night of fim

were Messers, and Mmes. Buddy 
Morris, Chas. Gowin, John Rogers, 
R. J. Harmon, N. V. Hamilton, G. 
R. Colvin, I. G. Grundy, Pierce 
White, Gaston Owens and Eddie, 
M. L. Roberson, C. P. Richmond, 
J. T. Persons; Mrs. Estelle Thomp­
son, Minnie Mae Roberson, Bill 
Helms, Maynard Wilson and Mr. 
and Mrs. Clayton B<md, of Flomot, 
who are members of the local 
Chapter.

Refreshments of h o m e m a d e  
cookies and coffee were served.

See Us
FOR ALL YOUR

BUTANE NEEDS
JENNINGS FARM SUPPLY

Day Phone 3211 Night Phone 2821
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A Complete Service a t

Morrison Gulf Service
TAB MORRISON

Phone 3561 -  Open 6 Days each Week -  Quitaque, Texas 
Double Buccaneer Stamps Wednesdays with purchase of $2.50 or more

> .m

FARMERS!!

Save Up to 30 percent
Our New

BLANKET FARM PERSONAL PROPERTY POLICY

gives you More Complete Insurance Protection at Rate Savings 
up to 3 0 %  ,and you get all this protection in one convenient 
"package". Ask us for complete details.

Check With
I

Stark Insurance Agency
Phone 2331 Quitaque, Texas

MRS. BENNIE REAGAN HONOREE 
AT PRETTY PINK AND BLUE SHOWER

Mrs. Bennie Reagan was honored 
Saturday, Feb. 17, with a  “Pink 
and Blue’’ Shower, given in the 
Bank Community Room between 
the hours of 2:00 and 5:00 P. M.

In the receiving line were the 
honoree’s grandmother, Mrs. Lew­
is Francis of Silverton; Mrs. Cecil 
Reagan, Mrs. Ronnie Carpenter, 
Mrs. Ruth West, aunt of the hon­
orée; her mother, Mrs. Milton 
Frizzell, and the honoree.

Hostesses for the occasion were 
Ruth Brunson, Joan Helms, Floy 
McCracken, Ira  Bnmson, Hattie 
Lois Carter, Bertie Jane Brunson, 
Carol Ann Bedwell, Linda Brannon 
and Chloe Hamilton. Their gift was 
a sterilizer.

Carolyn received many lovely 
and useful gifts.

Refreshments of homemade cook­
ies, punch, nuts and mints were 
served ta a number of guests.

------- o-------
PLAINVIEW, TEX., A sneak pre­

view of college life is scheduled for 
March 3 at Wayland Baptist Col­
lege for juniors and seniors in high 
schools of the area with their hosts 
being Wayland students and facul­
ty, who have planned a variety of 
activities.

Students wishing to qualify for 
$300 academic scholarships will 
present themselves for testing at 
8:30 a.m. with Dean Maurice J. 
Sharp in charge. Students wishing 
to audition for music scholarships 
and membership in the Internation­
al Choir and Treble Tones will be 
given appointments by Dr. J  O' De- 
Lage, head of the department of 
fíne arts. Athletes, on arrival, can 
arrange interviews with members 
of the athletic staff.

Campus tours will precede a cha­
pel program which features the 
Wayland International Choir and 
welcome addresses by President A. 
Hope Owen and David Causey, 
Hendersonville, N. C., president of 
the Student Government Associa­
tion.

After ibeing guests of Wayland at 
luncheon in Slaughter Memorial 
Center, career conferences will be 
held in two periods to give high 
school students opportunities to 
question faculty in various depart­
ments and to view departmental 
exhibits.

Informal group activities in the 
afternoon will include a talent show 
athletic contests, a hot dog supper, 
and vespers. An Evening of Drama 
by members of the Drama Depart­
ment under the direction of Dr. 
Henry Eason will conclude the 
day’s activities at 8:30 p.m.

In 1961 some 300 high school stu­
dents and counselors from 'Texas, 
Oklahoma, New Mexico and Colo­
rado were guests at Wayland for 
the College Preview.

To every prescription we fill is 
added . . . .

EXPERIENCE
and

SERVICE
SEE US FOR ALL YOUR 

SICK ROOM NEEDS

Morris Pharmacy
Where Pharmacy Is a Profession

Phone 3221 SHverton

C o n g ra tu la t io n s

Panthers!

The Merchants and friends whose names appear below extend hearty Congratulations to Coach James Roberts and members of the 
Quitaque High School Basketball team on winning the bl-district championship. They also wish the Panthers the best of tuck in the 
Regional Tournament. Most of them have indicated that they plan to close their stores and shops by 5 o'clock Friday afternoon in 
order that they might be in Canyon when you play. Best of Luck. We think you can win a trip to State.

Lolla Belle’s Beauty Shoppe 
Bedwell Hdw. & Imp. 
Roberson Dry Goods 
Quitaque Cleaners 

Willson & Son Lumber Co. 
F irst National Bank 
Stark Insurance Co.

City of Quitaque 
Bill Griffin -  Ralph Roberts 

Hughie’s Auto Parts 
Buck’s Phillips 66 Station 

Quitaque One-Stop 
Gulf Oil Corp. -  Bill Woods 
Panhandle Compress-Whse. 

Cantrell Grocery 
Pioneer Drug 

Pioneer Natural Gas 
Jennings Farm Supply

City Grocery 
Quitaque Flower Shop 

C. A. Hawkins, Furniture 
Saul Variety 

Morrison Gulf Service 
Johnston Drilling Co. 
Dick’s Barber Shop 

Wayne Martin 
Morrison T. V.
B. K. Hamilton 

Blankenship Grocery 
Jacob’s Auto Supply 

Bray Laundry 
Turkey Butane Co. 

Turners Home Laundry 
Ham Theatres 

West Texas Utilities Co. 
Rice Dry Goods
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CHURCH BOARD TO MEET
The Commissions of First Meth­

odist Church will have their meet­
ings at 7 o’clock Monday night, 
followed by the monthly meeting 
of the Official Church Board, 
Much attention will be given plans 
for the spring revival, which will 
b 4.pril 8-15 with Rev. R. L.

, Jr., of Gruver serving as 
evangelist.

PLANS FOR INQUIRER'S CLASS
Plans for the pastor’s Inquirer’s 

Class as First Methodist Church 
are getting into the final stages. 
The first session will be during the 
Church School hour on March 4th. 
The non-members of the church 
are being contacted and urged to 
attend. It is possible that by the 
close of the five sessions a number 
might be ready to come into the

membership of the church as 
group. An outstanding layman, Joe 
Salem of Sudan, has been secured 
to give his personal testimony to 
the group during the opening ses­
sion on March 4th. Brother Holman 
will mail a letter of invitation this 
week and a personal letter to many 
next week. There will be telephone 
calls made the morning of March 
4th as last minute reminders.

— Go To Church Sunday

Congratulations

Champs
We Are PuHIng For You To Go All The Way To Austin!

SWEETHEART BAKQÜET
FellowshipT Hall of First Meth­

odist Church was the scene of the 
Sweetheart Banquet, Wednesday 
night, February 14, which is spon­
sored by the Women’s Society of 
Christian Service a n d  Wesleyan 
Service Guild. This is an annual 
church-wide affair and husbands 
and guests are invited. At this 
time, secret pals are revealed and 
new pals drawn.

The Hall carried out the Valen­
tine motif, a bouquet of red tuliixs 
flanked by cupids adorned the 
piano. Each table was laid with 
tablecloth and napkins with Valen­
tine prints and large red and white 
hearts used in centerpieces.

Music comprised the program 
this year and a humorous reading, 
“The Little Red School House’’

was presented by Mrs. N, V. Ham­
ilton. The Rev. and Mrs. James 
Holman gave a stirring rendition 
of “Sweet Violets’’ among other 
numbers presented by these talent­
ed leaders. Mrs. Halman also play­
ed a medley of love songs on the pi­
ano. This was followed by group 
singing of several well - known 
love songs of yester-year. Closing 
the evening’s program, a number 
of hymns were sung by the group. 

The meal, as is the custom, was 
entirely of salads, served with a 
variety of crackers, jxjtato chips, 
pie, cake and other desserts and 
iced tea and .coffee.

Present for a deligfhtful evening 
of entertainment were Messers, and 
Mmes. James Holman, I. L. Ed 
gar, James Davidson, Webb Tay­
lor, Mort Hawkins, Morris Wilson,

On Special this week -  
LINCOLN CARTRIDGE-TYPE GREASE GUN

S3 6 5

We have a Fresh Stock o f . . . .

Willard Batteries
We are putting in new shelving and adding to our stock every 
day.

First National Bank
PHONE 2141 Member F.D.I.C. QUITAQUE, TEXAS

-  See Us Before You Buy -

Jacobs Auto Supply
Phone 3361 Quitaque, Texas

SALE LASTS ^ Ï 1  , MARCH 3

?LE BUTTER, Shurfine 28 oz.
(  :RRIES, R. S. P., Shurfine 303 cans 
CUtdMBER CHIPS, Shurfine Fresh -  16 oz. 
PEARS -  Bartlett -  Shurfne -  Halves -  303 
POT ATOES, Sweet -  Shurfine, Small Whole

4  for
APPLE SAUCE -  Shurfine 303 cans 
BLACKL '^E P EA S , Shurfine Fresh Shelled 300 
MH.K -  Canned Shurfine Tall Cans 
SAUER KBAUT -  Shurfine 303's 
SPINACH -  Shurfine 303 cans I

7 for
CATSUP -  Shurfine 14-oz.

'RUIT COCKTAH. -  Shurfine 303 cans 
GRAPEFRUIT Sections -  Shurfine 303 
GREEN BEANS -  Shurfine Cut B. L .303 
PEAS -  Shurfine Early Harvest 303

5  for

VIENNA SAUSAGE -  Shurfine 4 -oz.
PEANUT BUTTER 18-oz. 2 for $1.00
PORK & BEANS 300 size 9 for $1.00 
SALAD OIL Qt. $ .55
SALMON -  Red Alaska -  No. 1 $ .89
SHORTENING -  Shurfine -  3-lb. $ .69
TOMATO SAUCE -  8-oz. can -  10 for $1.00 
TUNA -  Chunk Style -  6 V2-OZ. -  3 for $ .89 
BROOMS -  Eimdale $1.19
WAFFLE SYRUP -  Shurfine 32-oz. $ .39

Shurfine

COFFEE
One Pound

1 9 «
With The 

Purchase of 
ANY 2 PEPSODENT 

TOOTH BRUSHES

For
Only

SALAD DRESSING ' S f S 9 «

DOG FOOD 1 3  f o r

P F A r i i r C  S H U R FIN E-Yellow  Cling
4  f o r

r O R M  s h u r f in e  Golden Whole Xer.u V r l U Y  ,0f jjy ig  _  j g j  j j j j è  f o r  ^ 1

ru n  r  s h u r f in e
4  f o r  1

P R F S F R V F ^  s h u r f in e  -  Aprlcot-PeaclI  l l L i O m i  Y I L O  R j j  pigg, _  20 j j '  î f o r ’ l

m C r i i l T Q  SHURFRESH
k J i j U i  1  o  gp Buttermilk -  8-oz. 1 3  f o r  ‘ 1

HAMS . . . .  h a l f  o r  w h o l e . . . l b . . .  3 9 «

RED POTATOES . . .  W-lb. bag . . .  40«
GRAPE JUICE -  Shurfine 24-oz. 3 for
CHEESE SPREAD -  Shurfresh 2-lb.
DETERGENT -  Energy Liquid -  22-oz. . . . . . . . . .
FLOUR -  Shurfine -  10 lb. paper bag ;  
FLOUR -  Shurfine 25-lb. print bag 
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE -S h urfin e  Natural -  46-oz.

$ 1.0 0  
$ .69 
$ .39 
$ .73 
$1.69 

2 for $ .59

MARGARINE -  Shurfresh -  M b . . . . . . . . .  6 for $1.00
MUSTARD GREENS -  Shurfine Chopped -  303 -  9 for $1.00 
NAPKINS -  Soflln -  White 80 cf box 2 for $ .25 
ORANGE JUICE -  Shurfine Unswt. 46-oz. 2 for $ .79
TURNIP GREENS -  Shurfine Chopped 303 -  9 for $1.00

DOUBLE BUCOANEER STAMPS WEDNESBAY ON ALL PURCHASES

Merrell Food^

paCHURCHES
ASSEMBLY OF GOD FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH

Pastor: Rev. James R. Smith Interim Pastor -  Rev. Dallas Roark
Sunday School . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9:45 Sunday School . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 9:45
Worship Service . . . . . . . . . . . 11:0 0 Morning W o rsh ip . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10:45
Evening Service 7:30 Training Union . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6:30
Prayer Meeting Evening Worship 7:30

Tuesday 8:00 Prayer Meeting Wednesday 7:00
W.M.C. Wednesday 3*00
Youth Meeting Sunday 6:30 CHURCH OF CHRIST

FIRST METHODIST CHURCH
Pastor: Rev. James C. Holman 

Sunday School 
Worship Service 11:0 0
4.Y.F. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6;00
ivening Worshp 7:00
llble Study, Choir Practice 

Wednesday 7;3Q
Mesusages for Sunday : 
METHODIST NEWS NOTES K
Simday morning — Continuation of 

Series from Apostles’ Creed 
“The Communion of Saints’’ 

Sunday evening — “The Sixth Be­
atitude’’; “Blessed are the Pure 
in heart’’

Morning ÿ rv ic e  10r30
Evening Service 6:00
Bible Study Wednesday 7:00

the other was “Agricultural Mis­
sions” . Furnishings for the Sunday 
School rooms was discussed a t the 
business meeting. The group was 
dismissed by prayer.

M. L. Roberson, Bill Woods, N. V 
Hamilton, W. F. Sauls, and J. W, 
Ewing, and

Misses Juanita Rhodes, and Min­
nie Mae Roberson, and Messers 
Ollie Nall and Bill Rucker; Mmes 
Geneva Curtis, Gladys Tipton, De- 
ene Tyler, Estelle Davidson, Grady 
Starkey, F. C. Benson, Estelle 
Thompson, Mary Pittman and Joe 
David Payne.

iij.1

Fiomot News
Mrs. L. B. Turner

E

0 .

'The Fellowship Hall at the First 
Baptist Church of Fiomot was the 
scene of the Sweetheart Banquet 
given in honor of the Fiomot High 
School students and their guests.

Pink decorated hearts and pink 
and white carnations added to the 
festivities. The climax of the decor­
ations was a large pink umbrella 
that covered the throne where the 
Valentine Sweetheart Queen was 
crowned.

The welcome address was given 
by Clois Shorter, followed by 
greetings by the pastor, Rev. Jack 
Terrell. Main speaker of the even­
ing was Mrs. G. C. Applewhite, 
who is English teacher at Lockney. 
Her subject was “Three Kinds of 
Love.”

Miss Joyce Shorter, a Freshman 
was chosen by the student body as 
Valentine Queen. Joe Martin of 
Matador crowned the Queen and 
presented her with a corsage of 
carnations.

The women of the church pre­
pared the meal which consisted 
of fried chicken, mashed potatoes, 
salad, hot rolls, iced tea, and heart 
shaired cake.

Students and their guests attend­
ing were: Misses Diane Reynolds 
and Donna Payne and Rickie and 
Dale Rowell of Silverton; Joe and 
Ima Jean Martin of Matador; Stan­
ley Nolen, Joyce and Qois Short­
er, Seab Washington, James Cy- 
pers, Aleta Neatherlin, Rodney 
Hammond, Lou Brannon, Morris 
Degan, Donnie Turner, Judy Gil­
bert, Danny Green, Billy Sperry, 
Jean Green and Sheldon Jacobs.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Fisher went 
to El Paso last week and visited 
their youngest son and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Fisher and family.

Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Turner re­
turned home Friday from a trip to 
Louisiana, where they visited their 
son-in-law and daughter and child­
ren, Mr. and: Mrs. C. R. Carson 
and family. They report a wonder­
ful trip and found their daughter 
improved.

Mr. and Mrs. L. D. Bilberry 
spent the weekend in the home of 
their son-in-law and daughter, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dick Dickerson and fam­
ily at Lubbock.

-------- 0--------
Wade Martin is a patient in Stan­

ley Hospital at Matador. He has 
been there for the past several 
days.

PINK AND BLUE SHOWER 
HONORS MRS. W. E. HAWKINS

Pink and Blue shower honoring 
Mrs. W. E. Hawkins was given 
Tuesday, in the Bank Community 
Room.

The serving table was centered 
with a stork holding a baby basket 
in its mouth, and surrounded by 
pink carnations and iris. Attract­
ive cupcakes .carried out the theme 
with safety pins and baby shoes 
on the frosting. These were served 
the guests with coffee, nuts and 
mints, from crpstal plates. The 
huge array of gifts included a 
maple crib, high chair (given by 
the hostesses), chest, gowns, dia­
per sets, diapers, and many more 
too numerous to mention. Approxi­
mately 30 guests registered.

Hostesses were Mmes. Bobby 
McWilliams, Billy McWilliams, D. 
J  Anderson, Ross Herrington, Ar­
nold Johnson, Gilbert Carpenter, 
and Rhonda King.

Visitors at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. J. T. Bradley home Sunday 
were Mr. and Mrs. Allen Matthews 
and Mr. and Mrs. H. S. Foster.

The W.S.C.S. of the Fiomot Meth­
odist Church met February 13 in 
regular session. The theme was, 
‘"The Mission in South America” . 
Two film strips were shown. One 
was “Rosa Makes a Choice” and

- Local Briefs -
Sunday dinner guests of Mr. and 

Mrs. Wayne Martin were Patsy’s 
aunt, Mrs. T. A. Gilmore, and Mr. 
Gilmore of Springfield, Ore., and 
Mr. Gilmore’s mother. Grandma 
Gilmore of Santa Anna, Texas. 
The Gilmore’s were enroute from 
Santa Anna to their home in Ore­
gon and his mother was return­
ing home with them for a visit. 

------- o-------
Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Bradley were 

in Turkey Tuesday on business. 
------- o-------

Mrs. F. M. Sachse spent the 
week-end in Silverton at the home 
of her daughter, the Merle Gra­
hams.

KEEP YOURSELF IN TRIM

Wilb a Regular Visll to

DICK’S BARBER SHOP

MOBILOIL MOBILGAS
Farm Deliveries

BAIRD OIL COMPANY

DISTRIBUTOR [ M o b ^ PRODUCTS
Quitaque, Texas Phone 3351

16526366



WMITADS
MATTRESS RENOVATION 

Direct Mattress Ck>. of Lubbock has 
40 years experience in building 
custom mattresses. We rebuild your 
mattress or let you trade it in on 
a  new mattress, innerspring, ortho­
pedic, or rubber foam. Ask about 
terms. Call 3131 for appointment.

19-tfc

SINGER SEWING MACHINE, and 
Singer Vacuum Cleaners. Sales- 
Service. Call 2251 Quitaque. Gordon 
Maddox, Memphis, Texas.

LOST: Blue Parakeet. Answers to 
name “Tony.” $10 reward to find­
er. Jack Hulsey. Phone 2422.

FEMALE HELP WANTED
A CAREER FOR YOU!

In the exciting cosmetic business 
Be an Avon Representative 

Write; Dist. Sales Mgr., Box 2017, 
Plainview, Tex.

FOB SALE : 1100-gaUon tank, on 
steel frame; $75. Jeff Sperry, Flo- 
mot. 36-2p

FOR SALE TO BE MOVED: Two 
small houses, size 30 x 14. Contact 
Jimmy Davidson 36-tfc

FOB SALE: 1959 Model Plymouth. 
26,000 actual miles. New rubber all 
around. See at Buck’s 66 Service. 
Mechanically in excellent condition.

36 -2C

FOR SALE: 1953 Model Ford trac­
tor, excellent condition. See Bruce 
Price, Phone 2784. itp

Prom ote—
Speaker Of The House
JAMES A. “Jimmy”

TURMAN

POLITICAL 
ANNOUNCEMENTS

The Quitaque Tribune has been 
authorized to present the names of 
th following candidates for office, 
subject to the action of the Demo­
cratic Primary, May 5, 1962.

For State Representative,
89th Legislative District;
Charlie Duming

H. G. Wells (Re-election)

For District and County Clerk;
Dee McWilliams (re-election)

For County Commissioner,
Precinct 2;

Mort Hawkins (re-election)

B. K. Hamilton 

Orval Cobb

For County Judge and 
Ex-Officio Co. Superintendent:

J. W. Lyon, Jr, (re-election)

M. G. Moreland

For Justice of the Peace 
Precinct No. 2:

J. W. Ewing (Re-election)

For County Treasurer:

Nettie V. Baldwin

For District Judge:

L, D. Ratliff (Re-election)

CARDS OF THANKS
To our many friends who were 

so kind and thoughtful during the 
illness and death of our loved one, 
we wish to express our sincere ap­
preciation for the kind deeds, the 
flowers, food and every remem­
brance. Words are so inadequate 
to express our heartfelt thanks 

The Currie Family

LIEUTENANT
GOVERNOR
DEMOCRATIC PRIMARY

Fight The Big 
Lobby In Austin!

write
“TEXANS FOR TURMAN”

C BOX 366 AUSTIN
PAID POU. AD V.

To all of our friends in Quita­
que who sent flowers, cards, gifts 
and food both to our home and to 
the hospital during mine and Bar­
ry’s recent illness, we want to say 
thanks to all of you for all of these 
kind deeds.

Wandell and Barry Johnson

I want to thank all my friends in 
Quitaque for all the many nice 
cards and all the kind deeds done 
for me’ while I was in the hospital. 
May God bless each of you 

Mrs. Fred Lacy
------- o-------

Mr. and Mrs. Milton Perry of 
Silverton were in Quitaque Mon­
day morning on business.

------- o-------
— DON’T GUESS — SOIL TEST —

Mr. Auto Owner!
Spring is nearly here. Come by and let us give your auto

A Complete Spring Check-up
Let us give your motor a good steam cleaning. We can also 
steam clean your radiator which will remove all bugs and trash 
for cooler summer driving.

CALL US FOR ALL YOUR FLAT TIRE NEEDS

BUCK’S 1 6  STATION
-  Free Pickup & Delivery -

Phone 3301 Quitaque, Texas

QUITAQUE CLEANERS
DOES IT BEST!

Our shop is euqipped with modern, up-to-date machinery and our 
workers know their business. We propose to serve you to the 
limit of our ability. You'll like the way we take care of your 
clothes.

Triple X Dry Sheen Method

We will be

OPEN SUNDAYS
Give your family a real treat—Come in and eat with us!

GIBSON’S FINE FOOD CAFE
Next Door to the Bank

CARD OF THANKS
I want to thank everyone who 

was so thoughtful in so mapy ways 
while I was in the hospital and 
since I returned home. Thanks for 
ail the cards, letters, flowers, tele­
phone calls, visits and for the food 
brought in since I came home. 
Thank you esx>Qcially for your pray­
ers.

Mrs. W. W. Cain
------- o-------

SCHOOL LUNCH MENU 
Monday, February 26
Chili Beans — (Z!om 

Dessert
Tuesday, February 27 

Fried Chicken & Gravy 
Potatoes — Dessert 

Wednesday, February 28 
Salmon Patties — Beans 

Salad — Dessert 
Thursday, March 1 

Meat Balls — Blackeye Peas 
Potatoes — Dessert 

Friday, March 2 
Sandwiches — Potato Chips 

Beans — Ice Cream

CHILEAN MISSIONARIES 
SPEAK A T METHODIST CHURCH

Last Sunday afternoon two ladies 
from Santiago, Chile, Señora Eliza 
de Elphick, and Sonora Ester Ros- 
sel arrived here for a brief visit 
at First Methodist Church. These 
two women wer described to our 
church as “two of the most conse­
crated, dynamic and talented wo­
men of the Methodist Church in 
the Republic of Chile.” Those in 
attendance Sunday certainly will 
agree that this is no mere state­
ment.

Sr. Rossel, a native of Chile, 
speaks no English, but her testi­
mony and facts about her work 
were ably translated by Sr. Elphick 
who was bom in Sweden. Sra. Ros- 
sell is an approved supply pastor 
in the Methodist Church, was edu­
cated by her mother. Her father 
was a Presbyterian minister and 
her capabilities from this religious 
training enabled h e r  to  obtain 
help through the church to go to 
San Ramon, a poverty-ridden mis­
sion to carry on the work. From 
this humble beginning, she now 
has a congregation of 140. At the 
beginmng, she had only five child­
ren as her membership. In addition 
to her pastoral duties, Sra. Rossel 
maintains a primary school in the

church for children from kinder­
garten to third grade. These pu­
pils number 75, and she has one 
helper.

Sra. Elphick came to Chile 41 
years ago as a missionary with 
the Salvation Army. She married a 
Methodist minister and twenty-one 
years ago she founded a home for 
the care and placement of child­
ren.

About 100 people were present 
to hear these women tell of their 
work. All money given was sent 
to further their work and did much 
to create interest in our area for 
foreign missionary efforts.

Delicate sandwiches, cookies, cof­
fee and tea were served to those 
attending.

Other churches represented were 
Matador, Flomot, White Flat, Tur­
key and Silverton.

another sister, Mrs. J. C. Cates of 
Shearman, and the Bmmmett’s 
daughter and her family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Qaud Sheets and children, al­
so of Spearman. Johnny went for 
a checkup with his doctor there on 
Monday, Johnny reports that he 
is feeling better at this time.

Mr. and Mrs. Anders of Grand 
Prairie arrived Saturday to spend 
a few days vacation with her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. R. L. Brunson.

LOCAL BRIEFS -
Billy Mac Farley is now stationed 

at Fort Carson, Colo., and would 
like to hear from anyone who 
would like to write him. His ad­
dress is Pvt. Billy Mac Farley, Co. 
M-3rd. Bn. Its. Tmg. Regt, Fort 
Carson, Colo

Mr. and Mrs. John Kyle and 
children of Amarillo spent Wednes­
day with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wallace Johnston.

Mrs. Minnie Norris of Childress 
is here this week visiting her sis­
ter and brother, Lela and Toby 
Honea.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnny Brummett 
drove to Borger Sunday where 
they spent Sunday and Sunday 
night visiting at the home of her 
sister, Mrs. Adele Williams. Other 
visitors at the Williams home were

Mrs. J. A, Taylor and Mrs. E, 
A Puckett visited Mrs. J. H. Sim­
mons at Crum Nursing Home at 
Lockney Monday.

------- o-------
Mr, and Mrs. Rayford Hewitt of 

Lubbock spent the week-end with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. T. 
Persons. They attended the Eastern 
Star 42 Party in the Bank Com­
munity Room Friday night.

------- o-------
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Taylor spent 

Saturday night in Amarillo with 
their daughter, Mrs. Dan Duncan 
and her husband.
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Mr. and Mrs. Corky Davis and 
son of Amarillo spent Saturday 
night and Sunday in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Ramsey and 
boys.

FARMERS UNION PRESIDENT
(Continued From Page One) 

which has recently been submitted 
to Congress.

“It is imperative to our nation 
that the traditional pattern of the 
family farm type agriculture be 
sustained and the whole future of 
this concept will be jeojardized 
if the new farm program has un­
favorable reception in the Con­
gress” , president Ñaman says 

“The lack of family farm safe­
guards in the past and the piece-

meal type farm legislation have 
brought about tiie depressed con­
ditions of the farm economy and 
the .comprehensiveness and im­
aginativeness of the new program 
is what is necessary to enable the 
farm economy to recapture its 
stability.”

“It is necessary,” president Ña­
man says, “that we have a per­
manent type, long-range feed grain 
and wheat program to reduce car­
ry-over as a means to improve 
farm income and reduce federal 
expenditures. This program must 
be locally administered by demo­
cratically elected agriculture sta­
bilization and .conservation service 
committees”. Ñaman added.

“It is imix)rtant that the object 
of this program be to improve 
rural living rather than to move 
people off the land and the land 
be taken out of production must be 
utilized for recreational and other 
purposes,” Ñaman said.

The Texas Farmers Union presi-

Mr. Farmer!
For Your Tractor Tire Needs Call Us
We have a complete line of Tractor Tires In Stock, and they 
are Reasonably Priced. We also have Calcium Chloride and 
Alcohol to Install In your Tractor Tires. We will come out In 
your field and pick up your flat tires for a very reasonable price.

CALL US DAY OR NIOHT

BUCK’S 6 6  STATION
Day Phone 3301 Night Phone 3071

Freda^s 
B eauty Shop

Rayette, Caryl Richards 
and Zoto's Permanents

Phone 3591

dent said that “the overall gOEil of 
the Agriculture Act of 1962 must 
be to afford the farmers the oppor­
tunity to achieve parity of income 
with other economic groups by 
providing them with the means to 
develop and strengthen their bar­
gaining power in the Nation’s ec­
onomy.”

President Ñaman also said that 
“it is extremely important that 
farmers participate: in the current 
wheat and feed grain sign-up since 
it is through this participation that 
they show the Congress their inter­
est in the farm program and their 
approval of the successful program 
of the last year. They also, by so 
doing, lend their support to solving 
the problems of unmanaged pro­
duction and falling income.”

NOW OPEN -
A  M E A L  O R  A

H O M E
COOMMG

R f i s o i a m
PRICES

-  HOME MADE PIES -  
Good Coffee

Closed Sutidays

C I T Y C A F E
Mrs. Hughie Waterman 

Mrs. Gordon Hulett

BUTANE -  PROPANE 
GHAMPLIN MOTOR OIL

Turkey Butane Co.
FORMERLY FLASH-O GAS CO.

Phone 3151 Turkey, Texas
|£]> i i m m t f t m t i i m t f P  |

. 0. R .M gINTOSH
OPTOMETRIST

i 211 South Main St. Floydada, Texas Phone YU 3-3460 |
3................. .................................................. .......

SALE LASTS THBOUGH SATURDAY, MARCH 3

Shurflne COFFEE lb $ .59
Shurfine APPLE BUTTER -  28-oz. 4 for $1.00
Shurflne APPLE SAUCE -  303 cans 7 for $1.00 
Shurflne BLACKEYES -  Fresh Shel'd -  300 7 for $1.00 
Shurfresh BISCUITS -  Sweef-Buttermllk-13 for $1.00 
Elmdale BROOMS $1.19
Shurflne CATSUP 14-oz. 5 for $1.00
Shurfresh CHEESE SPREAD 2-lb. pkg. $ .69 
Shurflne CHERRIES -  R.S.P. -  303 can -  4 for $1.00 
Shurflne CHILI with Beans -  300 size -  4 for $1.00 
Shurflne CORN Golden WK-CS -  303 size 6 for $1.00 
Shurflne CUCUMBER CHIPS -  16-oz. -  4 for $1.00 
Roxey DOG FOOD -  No. 1 cans -  13 for $1.00 
Energy DETERGENT Liquid -  22-oz. $ .39
Shurflne FLOUR -  10-lb. paper bag $ .73

Shurflne FLOUR -  25-lb. print bag 
Shurflne FRUIT COCKTAIL -  303 size 
Shurflne GRAPEFRUIT JUICE -  46-oz. -  
Shurflne GRAPEFRUIT SECTIONS -  303 -  
Shurflne GRAPE JUICE -  24^oz. -  
Shurflne GREEN BEANS -  Cut B.L. 303 -
Shurfresh MARGARINE -  Mb...............
Shurfine MILK Canned -  Tall Can -  
Shurfine MUSTARD GREENS -  Chopped 
Sofiin NAPKINS Whiet -  80-ct. box -  
Shurfine ORANGE JUICE Unswt. 46-oz. -  
Shurfine PEACHES Y.C. Sll. or HIv. VA -  
Shurflne PEARS Bartlett Hives. 303 -  
Shurfine PEAS Early Harvest 303 size -  
Shurflne PEANUT BUTTER -  18-oz. . . . . .

$1.69 
5 for $1.00

2 for $ .59 
5 for $1.00
3 for $1.00
5 for $1.00
6 for $1.00 

7 for $1.00 
9 for $1.00 
2 for $ .25 
2 for $ .79
4 for $1.00

4 for $1.00
5 for $1.00 

2 for $1 .0 0

Shurflne PORK & BEANS -  300 size -  9 for $1.00 
Shurflne PRESERVES **

Apricot - Peach - Red Plum 20-oz. 3 for $  ̂ JO 
Shurflne SALAD DRESSING -  Qt. $ .39
Shurfresh SALAD OIL -  Qt. $ .55
Shurfine RED SALMON Alaska No. 1 $ .89
Shurfine SAUER KRAUT 303 can -  7 for $1.00 
Shurfine SHORTENING -  3-lb $ .69
Shurfme SPINACH -  303 can 7 for $1.00
Shurflne SWEET POTATOES

Small, Whole 3 squat. 4 for $1.00
Shurflne TOMATO SAUCE -  8-oz. 10 for $1.00
Shurfine TUNA Chunk Style -  6V2-OZ. -  3 for $ .89 
Shurflne TURNIP GREENS Chopped 303 -  9 for $1.00 
Shurflne VIENNA SAUSAGE -  W  -  5 for $1.00 
Shurflne WAFFLE SYRUP -  32-oz. . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ .39

F U m -W IG H T  BACON M b .  pkg. 
T O M A T O E S . . . . . . . lb . . . .

9 5 «

25«
WHITE POT AT OES. . . .  10- l b . . . . .  49« 
WILSON’S NAM . .  I f l b .  c a n . . . . . . . 1 “

Phone 2631 
Quitaque, Texas

Double Gunn Bros. Stamps 
Wednesday On All Purchases

City G roce ry


