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CISCO F INALLY received 
some real football weather 
here this week, at least on 
Thonday night it was. The 
weather In Anson was clear 
and almost cold as the 7th, 
8th and J.V. teams played 
there.

C oats, b lankets and 
sweaters were in abundance 
in the stands as the fans wat­
ched the teams from Cisco. 
Cisco’s 7th grade team was 
the only group which won 
their game, but the other two 
teams turned in good perfor­
mances despite the final
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Benefit Bowl against Ranger 
Junior College with a 5-2 
season record. The Benefit 
Bowl Is played annually In 
Breckenridge and is schedul­
ed for Saturday night, Oc­
tober 22, at 7:30 p.m.

LJons Club members are 
selling advance tickets. You 
can save money if you buy 
your tickets In advance, as 
well as save time from stan­
ding in line waiting next 
Saturday.
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scoring.
Friday temperatures were 

predicted to reach into the 
80s, so the Friday night fans 
might not have been as cool 
as they were Thursday 
night.

TW 9 GRAND Openings of 
new businesses were held

CISCO JUNIOR CoUege 
won their game Thursday 
night and will be going into 
the annual Lions Club

here Saturday morning in 
the 200 block of East 8th 
Street. Little Shoes and The 
Flower Shop held their open­
ings this weekend.

Photos and some informa­
tion concerning the openings 
may be found elsewhere in 
this edition.

Be sure to go by and 
welcome them into Cisco’s 
business community.

IFEMC Füm
Set Sunday
On Sunday, October 16, at 

7:00 p .m ., the F irs t
E v a n g e lic a l M ethod ist 
Church on Hwy. 80 in Cisco 
will be showing a Billy 
Graham film entitled “ His 
Land”  about the land of 
Israel. Everyone is invited.

Jr. Varsity Loses

The Junior Varsity of 
Cisco High School lost their 
first District game of the 
season Thursday night 
against the undefeated 
Tigers in Anson. Cisco’s J.V. 
is now 3-1 in district play and 
3-3 for the season, while An­
son is 6-0 for the season.

Cisco scored first in the se­
cond quarter of play while 
Anson scored once in the se­
cond quarter, twice in the 
third quarter and received a 
Cisco safety in the third 
quarter, for a 26-8 win over 
Cisco.

Neither team was able to 
score during the firs t 
quarter of play. Cisco began 
their scoring drive during 
the last few minuts of 
quarter. With Brian Nichols 
at center, Cisco quarterback 
John Gonzales completed a 
pass to Dusty Deitiker to 
move the ball to mid-field. 
Stanley Callahan moved the 
ball to Anson’s 35-yard line. 
A run by Danny Kearney 
was stopped because of a 
Cisco penalty and the ball 
was placed back on the 
40-yard line to end the first 
quarter.

On their first play of the 
second quarter, Cisco QB 
Gonzales hit Michael Wester 
for a 40-yard touchdown pass 
play. In the try for two extra 
points, QB Gonzales com­

pleted a pass to Deitiker in 
the end zone to make the 
score 8-0 with 9:50 left in the 
second quarter of play.

Anson received the ball on 
the kick-off and began their 
own scoring drive. The 
T ig e rs  d rove  the ba ll 
downfield until it rested on 
Cisco’s oneyard line. On a 
quarterback sneak, Anson 
scored with 7:27 left in the 
second quarter. Their try for 
two extra points was good ty­
ing the score at 8-8 .

In the final seconds of the 
first half of play, Anson 
threatened to score again 
and their runner was stop­
ped on Cisco’s seven-yard 
line by James Berry as time 
ran out on the first half of 
play.

Anson received the second 
half kick-off at their own 
35-yard line and returned It 
to Cisco’s 43. On their first 
play, Anson took the ball into 
the end zone for a 43-yard 
touchdown run. The try for 
two points was good making 
the score 16-8 with 9:42 left in 
the third quarter.

On their second possession 
of the quarter, Anson put 
together another scoring 
drive when they received 
Cisco’s punt at their own 
38-yard line. In four plays

Seventh Wins Over
Anson, 8th Loses

Cisco’s seventh grade foot­
ball team won their first 
game of the season Thurs­
day night in Anson while the 
eigth grade team lost by the 
score of 26-14. The seventh 
grade score was 8-6 .

C isco Junior H igh ’ s 
seventh grade team is now 
1-2 for the season and the 
eighth grade team is 0-5.

In the seventh grade 
game, neither team was able 
to score during the first 
three quarters of play. At 
half-time the score remained 
(M), as it did at the end of the 
third quarter.

Cisco’s touchdown was set 
up when Doug Whitt in­
tercepted an Anson pass 
around the 35 or 40 yard-line 
of Anson and returned it to 
the one. With Whitt at 
quarterback, Kody Wallace 
took the ball and scored. 
Wallace also made the two 
extra points on the conver­
sion play giving Cisco an 8 8  
lead in th fourth quarter.

Anson came back and 
scored their own touchdown 
in the final quarter of play, 
but they fumbled the ball on

We now have 1984 Suc­
cess Calendars 
Commercial 

Printing Co. p-88

CISCO KID 
CAR WASH 

, 3rd St. and Ave. E 
W here Most Peop le! 
Wash. Wash your vene-| 
Man blinds, throw rugs,
ootor.

their try "for two so Cisco re­
mained in the lead 8-0 .

Good defensive plays for 
Cisco’s seventh grade were 
made by Greg Hammer, 
Benny R a m ire z , Cory 
Graves, Scott Stuart, Phillip 
Shackleford, Kody Wallace 
and Brady Brock.

In the eighth grade game, 
Anson scored twice in the 
first quarter of play, once in 
the third quarter and once in 
the final quarter. Cisco did 
not get on the scoreboard un­
til the final quarter of play 
when they scored  two 
touchdowns.

Anson scored early in the 
first quarter of play and 
again with 2:16 left in the 
quarter. Both times Anson 
tried an extra point kick but 
neither was good making the 
score 12-0.

In the final minutes of the 
first half of play, Cisco 
started out on their own 
40-yard line and drove the 
baU downfield to Anson’s 25 
on runs by Brian Wagnon, 
Andy Woody, Mark McGin- 
ness and quarterback Jarrod 
Jeffcoat. With 33 seconds left 
in the half, Cisco failed to get 
a first down and the ball 
turned over to Anson.

The first half of play ended 
with the score 12-0 , in favor 
of Anson.

In the second half of play, 
Anson fumbled on their first 
possession of the ball and 
Cisco’s Woody recovered it 
at Anson’s 41-yard line. Four 
plays later, unable to gulr a 
first down, Cisco’s McGin- 
ness punted the ball into the 
end zone.

Anson began moving the 
ball downfield and scored

with 2:29 left in the third 
quarter on a quarterback 
sneak play. The try for two 
extra points was no good 
making the score 18-8.

Cisco received the kick 
and began moving the ball 
downfield for their first scor­
ing drive of the night. Star­
ting out on Anson’s 37-yard 
line, Cisco moved the ball on 
runs by McGinness, Wagnon 
and Woody. With the ball 
resting on Anson's three- 
yard line, Wagnon took the 
pitch out from QB Jeffcoat 
and scored with 7:17 left in 
the final period of play. A 
handoff to Woody gained two 
extra points making the 
score 18-8.

Anson came back on their 
next possession of the ball 
and drove it downfield until 
they scored with 3:42 left in 
the gam e. The Anson 
quarterback kept the ball on 
the next play for two extra 
points making the score 26-8.

Cisco was still ready to 
play ball and when they 
received the kick, they 
started their second scoring 
drive from their own 28-yard 
line. Runs by McGinness, 
Wagnon and Woody, along 
with a pass from Wagnon to 
Jason Phillips, moved the 
ball downfield to Anson’s 
four-yard line with nine 
seconds left in the game. A 
pitchback to Wagnon gained 
the touchdown. A reverse 
play to Woody carried the 
ball into the end zone on the 
conversion play, but a Cisco 
penalty for holding wiped out 
the extra points. On their se­
cond conversion try, McGin­
ness was not able to get into 
the end zone, making the

Bond Election Ordered For
New Sewer Plant Financing

First District Game
they had moved the ball to 
Cisco’s 39-yard line. A pass 
com p le tion  netted  the 
touchdown for Anson with 
3:54 left in the third quarter. 
A quarterback keeper play 
gained two extra points mak­
ing the score 24-8.

Cisco received Anson’s 
kick at the three-yard line 
and Gonzales returned it to 
the 13-yard line. Following 
an incomplete pass, a one- 
yard run by Kearney and a 
four-yard run by Steve Ab­
bott, Cisco was forced to 
punt the ball from behing 
their own 20-yard line. A bad 
snap sailed over punter 
Shelby Nixon’s head and 
thru ^  end zone for a Cisco 
safety, making the score 26-8 
as it remained at the end of 
the game.

During the fourth quarter 
of play Cisco’s defense stif­
fened and although Anson 
managed to drive the ball in­
side of Cisco’s 20-yard line on 
three separate occasions, 
C isco ’ s defense stopped 
them from scoring.

Defensive standouts for 
the Cisco J.V. included 
Michael Wester, Jeff Dennis, 
Danny Kearney, Phillip  
Allen, Dusty Deitiker, Steve 
Abbott, Teddy Hull, James 
Berry, Stanley Callahan, 
John Gonzales and James 
Johnson.

Ordinances to call an elec­
tion of the proposition of ap­
proving bonds to finance 
waste w ater treatm ent 
facilities, to authorize Is­
suance of bonds to flnace 
w a te r system  im ­
provements, and to establish 
new water department rates 
were approved at the semi­
monthly meeting of the City 
Council last Tuesday night.

A bond e lection  was 
ordered for Saturday, Nov. 
19, at the Corral Room of the 
Laguna Hotel on the proposi­
tion of issuing 1675,000 in 
R even u e and G en era l 
Ohilgatlon Bonds to finance 
the construction of a new 
waste w ater treatm ent 
plant. M.L. Bailey was nam­
ed election  judge with 
Margaret Torres as alter­
nate judge.

The Council and engineers 
presently are seeking the 
most cost effective plan for a 
new facility to replace the 
present sewage disposal 
plant that has been con­
demned by state water and 
health auUiorities. Replace­
ment during 1984 has been 
mandated by court action.

The ordinance was passed 
as an emergency, which re­
quired only one reading. A 
town hall type meeting will 
be held at 7 p.m. Tuesday. 
Nov. 1, at the High Schoo 
au d itor iu m  to p erm it 
citizens of the community to 
study the matter. City of­
ficials, engineers and state 
water and health authorities 
will be at the meeting. 
G in ger  Johnson, c ity  
secretary, and Beth Prickett 
of the city hall staff were 
named absentee voting 
clerks.

An ordinance, also passed 
on emergency first reading, 
authorized the issuance of 
U tility  System Revenue 
Bonds in the amount of 
11,300,000 and confirmed the 
sale of the bonds to the Texas 
Water Development Board 
and the Farm Home Ad­
ministration.

Contracts were awarded 
last month for construction 
work in the system improve­
ment program, which will in­
clude a filteration plant at 
Lake C isco. A p re ­
construction conference is 
expected to be held in about 
10 days and work is due to 
begin soon after Nov. 1, City 
Manager Mike Moore told 
the Council.

Joe Sm ith , A b ilen e , 
em p loyed  by F irs t  
Southwest Corp. and acting 
as the city’s financial consul­
tant in the improvement pro­
gram financing, reported 
that the interest rate that the 
city will pay the Texas 
Water Resources Board on 
bonds has dropped in recent 
months from a projected 
10.95 per cent to 8.2 per cent. 
City plans call for 8800,000 of 
the $1,300,000 to carry the 8.2 
interst rate with the balance 
of $500,000 to bear interest at 
the rate of 5.65 per cent. The 
new rate, Mr. Smith said, 
would save ta xp a ye rs  
several hundred thousand 
dollars over the 30-year loan 
period.

The waste water project

was the subject of a site 
hearing at the meeting. In 
addition to the site just east 
of town on which the Concil 
holds an option, an alter­
native site has been offered. 
It is located northeast of 
town betw een  the 
Breckenridge highway and 
the old landfill.

Engineers told the Council 
that the optioned site would 
cost some $768,200 to develop 
while the alternate has an 
estim ated price tag of 
$1,204,61 .̂ Soil samples have 
been taken and tested in 
la b o ra to r ie s , the c ity  
manager reported. Frank 
Wilcoxen, R ^ d y  Honea and 
Ross Honea appeared as in­
terested citizens to ask ques­
tions.

The new water, sewer and 
sanitation rates, established 
in the ordinance on first 
reading, w ill ra ise the 
average minimum bill from 
$15.50 to $24.00 for all ser­
vices, Mr. Moore told the 
Council. It calls for a $12 
minimum of 2,000 gallons of 
water. The minimum for

senior citizens will go up 
from $12.50 to $21.00.

Meter deposits under the 
new ordinance will go up 
from $25 to $50 to $200, 
depending on the size of the 
tap. Customers who pay 
their water bills after the 
16th of the month wil be 
charged a $5 penalty. Sewer 
and sanitation charges re­
main unchanged.

Water customers living 
outside the city limits, who 
presently pay a $5 surcharge 
in addition to the minimum, 
will pay a $10 surcharge 
under the new ordinance. 
The ord in ance , which 
becomes effective Dec. 1 and 
with billing Jan. 1, will pro­
vide extra revenue to meet 
bond payment for the new 
improvements, Mr. Moore 
said.

The ordinance will be 
published as a legal notice in 
The Press in the near future.

The Council approved 
amendments to their finan­
cial advisory contract in con­
nection with financing the 
improvement program to re­

tain a bond attorneys for the 
loans as required by regula­
tions.

The Council held a pubhc 
hearing on the proposed 
revenue sharing program 
for 1983-84 and them adopted 
a budget calling for spending 
some $54,000. The funds will 
be used for capital im­
provem ents as fo llow s: 
police department, $3,000; 
h re department, $1,500; 
street department, $41,700; 
and w a te r departm ent, 
$7,100.

An agenda  item  to 
authorize obtaining a permit 
for the city to install 12-inch 
w a te r lines under the 
railroad right-of-way was 
tabled for study.

Manager Randy Speegle 
and Chairman Elaine Dixon 
of the Chamber of Com­
merce were present to make 
a report of revenues and ex­
penditures of the hotel oc­
cupancy tax for 1982-83 and 
to submit a budget for the 
com ing yea r . Incom e 
amonted to $15,212 and ex­
penses totalled some $8 ,100.

E xp en d itu res  included  
renovating signborads on 
1-20. A budget calling for 
spending $17,201 duiing 
1983-84 was approved. This 
will include $8,000 for adver­
tising, $4,000 in salary sup­
plements, $450 for office sup­
plies, $1,2 0 0  on special 
events and a sum for a sav­
ings account fund for use in a 
future community center 
project. t

City Court Judge Jasper 
Cook submitted a report for 
third quarter activities. The 
report showed that 98 traffic 
violation tickets were issued 
and some $1,106 was col­
lected in 10 bad check cases. 
The court’s gross income for 
the year amounted to more 
than $2 0 ,0 0 0  fo r  three 
quarters, the report showed.

Mayor Eris Ritchie presid­
ed at the meeting. Present 
were Councilmen Bobby In­
gram, Bobby Rains, Roy 
Dennis, Brad Kimbrough 
and Linton Batteas, City 
M an ager M oore , C ity  
Secretary Johnson and City 
Attorney Billy Wright.

final score 2614.
Cisco eighth graders who 

made good defensive plays 
were Mark McGinness, Jar- 
rod Jeffcoat, Joe Flores, 
David Reyes, Andy Woody, 
Jason P h illip s , Gordon 
D a v i i ,  B rian  W agnon, 
Robert Webb, Jerry Feiner, 
Tim Rains and William 
Pevey.

THE GRAND OPENING of The Flower Shop, 
207 East 8th Street, Cisco, was held Saturday 
morning. Members of Cisco’s Chamber of Com­
m erce assisted in the Ribbon-Cutting 
Ceremony. The new florist shop was to have a 
drawing at 4 p.m. that afternoon. The shop 
owner also said free carnations were to be 
given to all persons who had brought in draw­

ings for their grand opening. Shown at the 
ceremony were (left to right) Randy Speegle, 
CofC manager; Roy Dennis, CofC m em l^i; 
Gina Thompson, Flower Shop employee; Jody 
Thompson, owner of The Flower Shop; Fred 
Wheeler, CofC member; and Shirley Hargrave, 
CofC member, (staff photo)

A RIBBON-CUTTING Ceremony for the 
Grand Opening of Little Shoes, 205 East 8th 
Street, was held Saturday morning in Cisco. 
The specialty shop for children’s shoes was 
assisted in its grand opening by several 
members of the Chamber of Commerce. Shown

in the picture above are: Fred Wheeler, CofC 
member; Mrs. and Mr. Bill Hester, CofC 
members; Dela Sedillo and Nancy Bacon, Lit­
tle Shoes owners; Roy Dennis, CofC member; 
Shirley Hargrave, CofC member; and Randy 
Speegle, CoK manager, (staff photo)
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JU ST CALL

^  442-2244 .
Have something to buy or sell? O ne ^

phone coll to us is like d ialing 
our entire circulation person-to- 
person! Place your W on t Ad  tod ay !
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SUBSCRIPTION
RATES:

In Eastland County 
$14. In Adjoining 
Counties $18. In 
other Texas Coun­
ties $20. Out of 
Texas $25. No out- 
o f - c o n t i n e n t a l  
United States ex­
cept for APOs.

NOTICE: Unless you have established credit
with tbe Cisco Press ail classified ads must 
be paid in advonce.

IM I’O K T W T  
4 hf«'k  Miiir :i(l llu- 

F irst l>a> It :ip|M'ars In 
«•\»‘Mt of errors, please 
call in im e d ia te U  to 
ha\e It eorri’eted. \ o  
I'la iiiis Mill Im' a llow ed  
for m ore than one ineor- 
reet insertion.

T'he publishers liahili- 
t> shall be limited to on- 
l> the amount of space 
eoiisumeii b\ these er­
rors.
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CL'STOM  m o v a b l e  
HOMES

We handle it all from 
drawing your blueprint to a 
turn-key job on custom 
movable homes. All sizes 
and all prices to any sta^e of 
com p le tion . C a ll (915) 
646-5464, for brochure or 
come by H ighway 183, 
Brown wood, to E a rly  
Lumber p-ltfc.

DOZER SERVICE 
Tanking, brush pushing] 
and all t>pes n4 dirt| 
work. $.35 per hour 
Minimum 4 hours. Call I 
Bob Hallmark. 442-2127. | 
p-tfc

N JT IC E : F'or home
delivery of the Abilene 
Reporter News! If you li\e 
north of 8th Street or w est of 
Avenue N call Morgan Flem­
ing, 442-3031 p4)tfc

w il l ia m s "'
CONSTRUCTION 
& INSULATION 

For all your New, 
Homes, Rem odeling 
and Metal Construction | 
needs. 442-1933. p-14tfc

I In ONE FAMILY Out I 
OF 5. MOTHER Gets a | 
JOB To Help PAY For a 
CHILD S UNIVERSITY 
e d u c a t io n , i .i f e  in ­
s u r a n c e  Can Help 
AVOID t h is :

ourv ER WEST 
Wator Well Service 

2*2 mi.. So. Rising Star 
*3 to 2 H.P. in stock 

817-643-4683 
Call Anytime

.Allen's Heating 
Vir ( onditiDiiing 
Sales 4 .Sert ice 

854-1795. Baird p-tfi

“ Hollis Williams Con­
struction"

Blown rrllulosr Inoulallon. mrul 
•'outnirtlon. or» homof. rutlnin 
raMnote. roarrotr. rlortrlral work 
and other rrroodHinfi nrrd,

44MS31 Tt

TIM BVRTON 
Ciiiistrm tioii 
4 Insulation 

New Homes, add-oiis. 
cabinets, metal const., 
concrete , e le c tr ica l 
work 4 blown cellulose 
insulation. Call 442-3727 
a fte r  S. 442-4049 
daytime. p-59tfc

CONSTRUCTION
‘ 4 « q - 2 - 1 7 0 9

Remodeling, Add-ons, New Homes, 
Cabinets, Electrical Etc Free Estimates

JOURNEYMAN ELEC­
TRICIAN recently mov­
ed to Cisco needs work. 
Does a reliable-safe job 
for a readsonable fee. 
Housewiring, etc. No 
job too small. Mike Mar­
tin. 442-1598. p -87

I will haul off tree limbs, 
junk. ect. CaU 442-2572. 

p-87

Taylor Center Laundry 
Wash 

SO cents 
100 Ave. D 

TF

N O T IC E : Business 
records & bookkeeping 
services, income tax 
returns, m onthly & 
quarterly reporting for 
business, fin a n c ia l 
statements, individual, 
partnership, corpora­
tion, notary public ser­
vice. Goode Business 
Service, 205 W. 11th, 
Cisco. 442-3044 p-83

Oilfield Tank Bottoms 
Cleaned. Cisco Reclaim­
ing Crude. Inc. Cisco 
Texas. (817)442-4341 
p-91

Avon Office 
1307 Avenue A 

442-1185
Gladys Taylor, p-84

GARAGE SALE: Oct. 15, 8 
a.m. - 5 p.m. Sixth house on 
left on Rising Star Highway. 
Several rifles, 1978 Yamaha 
fully equiped- $1600, gas 
range, glass showcase, 8 
horsepower grass vacuum, 
some children clothes, p-83

GARAGE SALE: RoUaway 
bed, desk, tools, cooking 
vessels, drapes, dishes, 
much more. Wednesday, Oc­
tober 19 and Thursday, Oc­
tober 20 at 1302 Ave. N. fv83

I
i

Make Good Money ■
Sell Avon 1

S contaci Gladys Taylor s
1307 Ave. A |

i  442-1185 (>-87 |

H O U SE K E E PE R - Maid- 
Cook. I ’ ll do what you 
haven’t time to do. Ex­
perienced. Call 442-4829 p-84

G.W, RABEL IS BUILDING 
HOMES ready to move onto 
your site or will sitebuild. 
Custom hom es, barns, 
garages, decks or add-ons. 
Call Gary or Lloyd at 
442-4647 or 442-3430. tc.

BOOKKEEPING SER­
VICES
It’s getting close to the 
end.of the year! I f  you 
don’t have time to get 
the books ready, call 
me. Familiar with far­
ming & oil reports, 
payroll 8c quarterly 
reports. All Information 
in strict confidence.

Mary L. Anderson 
Rising Star 817-643-4166

Piano lessons, e x ­
perien ced  tea ch er. 
B eg in n in g, in ­
termediate and advanc­
ed, children and adults. 
South of Cisco. 725-6731 
P'9

FAST GROWING KVM X 
FM 97 needs sales persons 
today, to serve our rapidly 
growing list of advertisers! 
See Skip at FM 97, or call 
62&658S now. TF

CHIMNEY SWEEP 
CALL 442-4259 

Between 11:00 & 1:00 
p-91

GARAGE SALE: October 
18-19. 306 W. 7th St. Hours- 
8-5:30. Magazines, table & 
chairs, Avon bottles. Men & 
Women clothes, sweater, 
coats. Venetian blinds, 8c 
mise, p-83

MOVING SALE: Sat., Sun., 
Mon. Oct. 15-17. Tappen gas 
ran ge , Hot Po in t 
refrigerator, kitchen table, 
clothes-all sizes, lots of 
miscellaneous items. 1707 
Ave. E. p-83

GARAGE SALE: Ave. Q 8c 
14th. A l it t le  b it of 
everything. Lots of plants 
and hanging baskets. 
Clothes, shoes, starts Mon. 
at 9 -Fri. until all is sold. 
442-3634 p-84

GARAGE SALE: 104 Ave. G. 
Whirlpool-upright freezer, 
e x c e lle n t  cond ition , 
r e fr ig e ra to r ,  s tove, 
typewriter, caculators, full 
bed, all prices reduced. Also, 
I will do baby sitting in my 
home, p-63

u iiiiiiiiiim iiiiiiiiiiitiiiiiiiiiiu  
i  Child care in my home. = 
= Monday-Friday. §
= Janie Wilson =
i  „  1500 Bullard =
I  442-4268 p-91 |

niiiiiiM iiiiiiim iH iiiiiiM iiiiiir

FOR SALE: Recondi­
tioned b icy c les ,
m ow ers, t il le rs , 
mini bike, edgers. Bicy­
cle and mower repair. 
408 West 10th. p-82

c FOR RENT

CASEY’S CAKES 
Wedding. Birthday, An­
niversary, All Occasion 

Cakes.
$7.50 8c up 

442-1183

STRAYED: One red brindle 
striped hereford cow from 
place southwest of town. Has 
4-S brand on right hip. If 
seen call 442-1481 after 2:00. 
p64

LOST: Silver 8c black Ger­
man Shepherd, fem ale, 
Reward offered. 442-3646. 
p-84

FAST GROWING KVMX- 
FM 97 needs sales profes­
sionals today, to serve our 
rap id ly growing list of 
advertisers. See Skip at FM 
97. or call 629-8585 now. TF.

FOR RENT

FOR RENT: Small partially 
furnished, 2 bd. house at 
Cisco Country Club. Chance 
for a sideline business. Must 
see to believe. $150.00 month. 
442-2725 or 442-2666 or write 
Box .389, Cisco, p-86

FOR RENT: Small partially 
furnished 2 bd. house at 
Cisco Country Club. Chance 
for a sidline business. Must 
see to believe. $150 month. 
442-2725 or 442-2666 or write 
Box 389, Cisco. p6 6

FOR RENT: 3 bd. house, 
442-1638. f>63

FOR RENT: New office 
spaces available. You 
tell us the size office you 
need. Call 442-3024. 
p-55tfc.

N IC H O L S  H O M E  IM P R O V E M E N T

• New Home, Add ons

•  Concrete Walks & Drives

•  Framing 8c Comice Work

•  Cabinets & Formica Tops 

•  Paneling, Sheetrock

•  Floorcovering 8c Ceramic 
T i l e

•  Garage Conversions •  Paneling & Trim

•  Screened Proches •  Dryw all & Acoustic Ceilings

Complete Home Remodeling & Repair

442-3737

FOR RENT: 2 Bd. furnished 
house and small 2 Bd. 
tra ile r . Ernest Barker. 
442-3117. p-83.

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom 
house with central air 
and heat, 1206 W. 13th, 
Cisco. Call after 7, (817) 
559-8041. p-89

MI N I  WAREHOUSE 
STORAGE as low as $20 
month. Call 142-3340. 
Cisco. p-57tfc

Wosher-Dryer-Refrigeration Repair
Whirlpool, Konmore, 

Gonord Doctrk, 
Hot Point

Ted Parrish
Route 2 

Box 240A-1
Cisco, Texas

15 Ytort Exporionco
Formeriy Factory Service

AN Wofi 

G o o ro n to o d

442-3674

WANTED
Avon Representative 
CaU Cynthia Jones 

817-643-3335 p-91

W ANTED : I w ill clean 
houses. Experienced. Call 
after 2:00 p.m 442-3437. p-83

WANTED: Paint and 
body w ork. F ree  
estimates. 442-3725 or 
rome by 1701 Ave. L, 
Cisro. p-88

FOR SALE: Used 5 ton 
Chrysler air temp, electric 
central air 8t heat unit. 
$230.00. Call 442-1582 p-83

For Sale: 1979 Kawsaki 
650. Actual mUes are 

.1,500. $1500 C a ll
J45-2866. p-87

FOR SALE: Two colonial 
light fixtures like new Call 
442-1303 to see after 5 p.m.TF

Video dull player Mith 4 movies. 
$200. Intellivision game (yttem. 
Inlelllvoice Module and 7 game 
vartriget. $200. All like new. 
442.4080. p-88

FOR SALE large air com­
pressor for a station or shop. 
Reasonably priced. 643-2563. 
33-2tp

FOR SALE: 1980 Chevy 
Silverado Pickup. FuUy 
load ed . C a li
442-3725.P-87.

R E PO SS E S SE D  S IG N ! 
Nothing down! Take over 
payments $58.00 monthly. 4’ 
X 8 ’ flashing arrow sign. 
New bulbs, letters. Hale 
S igns. C a ll F R E E  
1-800-626-7446, anytime, p-84

Trade 32’ motor home 
for equity In home. In­
quire at 703 E. 22nd in 
Cisco, p-88

Mobile Home For Sale: 
12’ X 65’ Newm4M)n with 
12’ X 24’ den added on. 
'Two chainlink fenced 
lots. Has fruit trees and 
large garden spot. Also 
two storage sheds. Call 
442-2161 and ask for 
Mike, p-88

Orphan House Needs 
Home! Located in Put­
nam on 3 lots. 6 rooms 
and u t ility  porch . 
Garage storage room 
and ch icken  coop 
located behind house. 
CaU after 5 p.m. 442-4766
p-88______________________

IFO R S A L E  BY 
O W N E R : L a rg e  3 
bedroom house recently 
remodeled in Cisco with 
extra lot. Contact W.E. 
Dean, 701 W. 7th for ap­
pointment. p-87

FOR SALE: By owner, 
nice 3 bedroom, 1 bath, 
total electric, carpeted, 
brick home on lot and a 
half, with fireplace and 
14’ x l8 ’ deck . C all 
442-3725. p-89

Very beautiful three bedroom, two bath frame, with 
two room and bath servant quarters in rear, fencetl 
back yard sitting on about two blocks of very gootl 
ground, with large shed, new on the market and very 
desirable, $55,000.00

Very nice 5 room frame with large garage and 
storage buUdlng on paved street and good location, 
$32,5000.00

Attractive brick, roomy, with large walk-in closets, 
best part of town, and very well worth $55,000.00

You wUl like this ope, very soUd frame, good yard 
and only $15,000.00

We have several good 5 room dwellings priced from 
$15,000.00 to $19,500.00 ask about them, one has 10 lots 
with it.

We, also, have brick dwellings of aU kinds, inside and 
outside of the city limits, you can have one story or two 
story’s, and we want to seU them.

We have two story frame dwellings, commercial 
buU4lings, 80 A. land, you name it. ( smaU tracts are aU 
sold).

WE ARE DOING BUSINESS AND WANT TO DO 
M O RE !! REMEMBER THE CONTENTS OF THIS AD 
IS ONLY A SMALL PORTION OF ’THE PRO PERTY 
WE HAVE TO SELL, 1 MEAN WE HAVE IT !!  JUST 
TELL US WHAT YOU WANT..

807 Ave. D ., Cisco

Garl D- Gorr 
Real Estate Brokerage

Three soles men to ossist in aU phoses 
of the work. 442-3642 or, night 442-1642

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
I.arge 3 bedroom house on 2 
lots, excellent investment. 
Assume $9200.00 note. Owner 
carry small second note. 
Call 512-288-0749. p-48tnf

FOR SALE : 5 bedroom 
home. 1000 West 6th, Cisco. 
D ow n sta irs  co m p le te ly  
red eco ra ted . $46,500. 
442-2366 or 442-1993. p48tnf.

Location Location Loca­
li tion
» HOUSE FOR SALE 
“ 604 Ave. F. Commercial 
2 or easy retirement pro- 
a perty. Post Office, town 

at fingertips. Let’s show 
you the extras.

442-2272. p-84

Must sell 10 acres with 
sewer, e lec tric ity  & 
water hook-ups. SmaU 
equ ity  & take up 
payments.

CaU 442-4228 
After 8:00 p.m. p-83

FOR SALE  OR R E N T :
Large 3 bedroom house on 2 
lots, excellent investment. 
Assume $9100.00 note. Owner 
carry, smaU second note or 
pay $250.00 month rent and 
$150 dep os it. C a ll 
512/288-0749. p-76tfc.
| • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • |

•  House for Sale: Large 3 i
•  bedroom, 2 car garage ^
•  with storage. Remodel- S
•  ed. F o r  inform ation •
•  945-2866. p-87 •
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •
FOR SALE: 3 lotsv 1221 Ave.f 
D. CaU after ,5. 442-f500 p-87 ^

HOUSE FO R S^Ll^ in  (>oss 
Plains 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
new carpet, corner lot, 
garage, shade trees. Close to 
churches, post office, ideal 
fo r  r e t ir e d  couple. 
817-725-7435. 41-ltp

•JiiiiiiMiiiiiiimiTMiiiiiiiiiT.rn:
I  For Sale: 1976-72 ft. = 
z  m obile home. $1500 E 
E equity, assume $7000.12 = 
= % note. 442-1447. p-87 =

E iiiiiiM iiiiiiiiiiim iiiiiiiiiiM ir

713 E. 23rd. ENERGY EFFECIENT, 3 bedroom, 1 
bath, with fireplace, beautiful yard, utility room, car­
port, greenhouse, storage shed. $42,500.

404 W. 9th. Spacious 3 bedroom, 2 bath, home with 
Central H/A on 3 lots, pecan trees. Small rent house in 
back. $55,000.

1209 Mancill, Neat frame, 2 bedroom, 1 bath, den 
with fireplace, carport, storm windows. $36,500.

Northside Lake Cisco, cabin on pretty wooded lot, 
with dock and deep water. $18.000.

Overlooking Lake Cisco golf course. 5 bedroom, 3 
bath, formal living with fireplace, dining room, den, 
utility and two car garage. $125,000.

1407 Simms, three good size bedrooms, game room, 2 
bath, double sided fireplace, fenced yard, in good 
neighborhood. $74,500.

Anita Webb, Associate, 44^3546

Sharon Wiicoxen, 442-1849

(y^f€ C 4 ‘ .9-/ if f in * /  / -.i

NEW BRICK HOME
3 Bedroom -2  Bath House In New K im ber Lea Estate*

Country Living with City W ater &  Nat. G as &  W ’ T ' U ’

Price *33,500.00

Building Lots For Sole 

Build Your Plans or Ours

Construction By 
C B S  Construction 
442-3148 442-1580

SALES
Cham ness Realtors 442-3148  442 -1144
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County Classified
Simdav. O ct. 16. 1983

1. AiitMivrSaU

SALE 1979 Kawasaki 
SR SSO Motorcycle. Good 
condition. Excellent price. 
Call 129-1116 T83

GODFREY'S PLUMBING- 
We do septic tanks, roto 
rooter, backhoe service. No 
job too small. Phone 647-3429 
anytime. Owner Jesse God­
frey, Jr. TC

I. vt Sarvict

STEVE’S GARAGE 
Ranger, Texas 

647-1651

Used Transm is.« 
•**rters and alternators

Top dollar for wrecked 
•ad/or jock cars 
TC

la. Auction«

a. Boot« ft Trailer«

CALL US FIRST 
ior all aiu-UoD Deed«: .. 
TUCKER AUCTION CO. 

Rl. 1 Boi N EaiUaod, TX 7M4I

CaU CoUecI
C«B«l(Bmral «air tad Sat of 

each moatĥ  OUpm TC

FOR SALE- Star Craft walk 
through ski boat, 65 HP Mer­
cury, tut traUer, 15 inch 
tires, canapoy top, gas 
tanks, fully loaded, exceUent 
condition. Very reasonable. 
629-9623, Eastland. T83

XX. Feed U Scad

FOR SALE: 
Round Bale Hayfeeders 

See at 501 East 18th 
Cisco, Texas 

CaU 442-4319 p-S3

as. • «m Im m  aervlee

Darathy’s Sunshine Fabrics 
Now Open 1010 E. 18th 
64M57S P90

XX. LIveatock ft Pet«

WANTED Big Country Ap- 
pitites. The Pizza House. 
6291138. On the square in 
Eastland TF

FOR SALEFood for Big 
Country appetites at The 
Pisxa House. 629-8838 In 
Elastland on the Square. TC

AVON
648-3934

M.H. PERRY 
Southland Life Ins. Co. 

offers protection 
•Life «Cancer 

•HospRaHsation 
•Group Plans 

•Accident/Sickness 
IM  N. Lamar -  629-1566 

Evenings: 629-1095

 ̂ FOR SALE: Brangus 
Bu lls. 647-1182 or
647-1155. TF

XS. Sulldina Supplie«

Th« Cloth«6 Hors«
lots of loons In small alias 

613 W. 7lh. Cisco 

P93

B U ILD IN G  M ATE R IALS  
FO R  S A L E : Lum ber, 
plywood, siding, moulding 
and much more. Visit our 
sales office for prices. Hours 
8 a m. to 4 p.m. Mon. thru 
Fri. Open Saturdays 9 a.m. 
til noon. Morgan Building 
Corp. H w y. 69 North , 
F^astland, Tx. T-tnf

XO. Furniture

DESKS. CHAIRS, files, 
safes, cash and carry. 
Save 20-50 percent. 
Larae selecUon. 9-5:30 
weekdays. Value City 
1930 Butternut, Abilene.

WANT TO BUY used 
furniture. S&K Sales. 
515 E. Main, Eastland. 
Call 629-8382 or 629-2241. 
TC

xa. Antique«

FOa SALE: ‘Aedqer Glau aed 
FereJtarr' e«d oU|cr rollrc- 
IM««. ‘We bey E«Ulc«.' Thr 
H««ii «f AaUqec« iMved to M  
8. B««««U. Eeitlaad. Tria« 
apte evrrjf dey. TF

W E C A R E  A B O U T 
YOUR HEALTH 

Spadallsiag in physical 
allaMats related to the 
•p iac  aad aervous 
system.

Dr. Geo. G. McPhaul 
Chiropractor 

Telephone 947-3821 
4M Plae Street Ranger 
Please Clip A  Save. TC

FOR SA(.E: ‘Antique Glass 
and Furniture' and other col­
lectibles. ‘We buy Estates.’ 
The House of Antiques 908 S. 
Bassett, Eastland, Texas. 
Open every day. TF

XX. Miac. lo r  Sale

FOR SALE: Transfer Case 
w/3 speed standard 
transmission for 4 wheel 
drive Chevrolet pickup. Call 
442-2757 after 5 weekdays. 
Anytime during weekend, tfc

I MARY KAY COSMETICS | 
. Patricia Gohlke . 
I Beauty Consultant II 647-1411 or 647-1155 .
I j c ___________________ i

*  RAblO  STATION KVMX- 
FM 97 is now Super Country 
music in stereo! Enjoy Paul 
Harvey 3 times every week­
day! *  TF

IS. Buaiuaaa aorvict

NOTICE: Dak« Job«««« 
Caatrartor-EeafdcIlBS, C«a- 
ercte, Elaetrical, PI«Bbla(, 
FaaelM. »«ck, Howe
Urallag. Call MT-lSIt ar 
MMnt.TC

FOR SALE: Hallmark 
Store in Eastland Coun­
ty. No franchise fees. 
Some owner financing 
available. Send serious 
inquires to: S.V. and P. 
207 S. Lamar, Eastland, 
Texas 76448. TF

SCHOOLMASTER ANTIQUES 
s3»-znf

Wf will buy oor itrm or an 
ratal«. Call (or appralaalt. Itrou 
lor sal« or special items you 
wish to purchase. TC

A d v e r t ÌB Ì n g  Pays

Bastlaad Boslncss Ser­
vices

' ‘Ceaqdete lacome Tax 
Sendee aad Accoanting 
CaB 629-lMl or 829-1644

FREE Swap shop on KVMX- 
FM 97 Radio - twice every 
Monday thru Friday at 8:30 
a.m. and 12:30 noon. Call 
629-8585 and te ll the 
Microplex what you have to 
sell, rent, give away or to an­
nounce! It ’s free community 
service of KVMX-FM 97 
Radio.___________________ TF

XX. Mlac.for Salt

ELROD'S MOBILE LOCK 
SHOP- Keys made, locks 
changed or repaired. Auto 
Residence and commercial. 
Bonded Locksmith. 423 W. 
Main, Ranger, Texas 76470. 
Phone 647-3444. TC

Poor Boy Resale Shop 
»lew & Used Merchandise 

upstairs above B&W 
Furniture 

304 Commerce St. 
629-8903

Northview Workshop 
Wood Craft Workshop 

Wooden Gifts and Toys 
For Sale

See at 401 W. Moss 
_______ 629-2624.

FO R  S A L E : 38 ft. 
Tandem axle pipe and 
sucker rod trailer. Heavy 
duty. Ca ll
817-643-1515. P83

AKC W EIM ARANERS -8
week old with shots. Cham­
pion blood line. Fine family 
dogs, natu ra l hunters. 
915-762-3721. T86

XX. Garage Salta

G A R A G E  ^ A L E : 524 
Crestwood, Eastland. Thurs­
day. Oct. 13, 8 a.m. through 
Saturday, Oct. 15 G irl’s 
clothing and a little bit of 
everthing._______________

X4- WanteO to Buy

FOR SALESanta Gertrudis 
Bull, 3 year old King Ranch 
Stock - super bull. Call C.A. 
Dawson (817)647-1492 TC

FOR SALE : R egistered 
ADC Boxer pups, 6 weeks 
old. 442-3042. p.85

g
XS. Hal* Wanted

HELP WANTED: Part-time 
S ec re ta ry  W anted fo r 
Eastland County Probation 

■ Department. Apply in per­
son, 3rd Floor Eastland 
County Courthouse TF

RUSSELL NEWMAN is now 
hiring machine operators. 
Starting salary is $3.50 hr. 
West Interstate 20 in Cisco. 
p-83

E A S T L A N D  C O U N T Y  
SHERRIFS DEPARTM ENT
is accepting applications. 
Must be a high school 
graduate of have G.E.D. 
Duties and responsibilites of 
ja ile r  include, but not 
limited to Booking prisoners, 
preparing bonds, fingerprin­
tin g , su p erv is in g  and 
photographing inm ates. 
Jailers are required to cer­
tified within a year after 
employment. Experienced 
prefered. Please appply in 
person at 201 West White, 
Eastland, Texas. We are an 
equal opportunity employer. 
_______________________  TF
XT. Foaltlona Wanted

P O S IT IO N S  W A N T E D : 
Heavy equipment operator 
w ith construction  and 
pipeline experience seeking 
employment. Call evenings. 
629-2237. TF

HAY HAULING 
Call Carl Bray 
44M447 p-71

41. Agt. lor Brnt

FOR RENT: Furnished or 
unfurnished apartments. 
Royal Oak Apartments, 1304 
Royal Lane, Cisco, Call 
442-3232. TC

APTS. FOR RENT: 1 and 2 
bedroom apts., furnished, 
water and TV cable paid. 
Fontain Apts. Cisco. Call 
442-2320 or 442-3338. TFN

Advertising Pays!
FO N TA IN  APT.-Now  
lea s in g , 1 or 2 
bedroom s. $210-$225 
month. Water and cable 
paid. 215 W. 8th, Cisco. 
915-893-5082. p-68tfc

4X. Heuaaa 1er Bant

CENTURY 21-Eastco Inc. 
Several Houses for rent. 
647-1302 or 647-1635. T-tfc

FOR RENT- 2 bedroom 
country home with Franklin 
fireplace, very nice, on Vk 
acres right outside Olden. 
Prefer couple with no young 
children. $300.00 a month 
with $200.00 deposit. Call 
629-1369 and leave name and 
phone number. T83

4S. Butin««« Property

FOR SALE:Choice building 
site; retail, industrial, com­
mercial. Right in the heart of 
the action, just off East Main 
St., Eastland, Tx 76448. Tf

4*. Houaoa lor Sale

WANT TO BUY: Would like 
to buy an older, heavy silver 
tea and coffee service with 
tray, in good condition for 
personal use. Call 629-2413. tf

B R IC K H O M E- C isco
IV^lots, fireplace, patio, and
m ore. B ig  Country.
442-1693. p-91

i W v e 5 5 |

3 BE D RO O M  ROCK 
HOUSE- 15 acres, 2 irriga­
tion wells, 30 pecan trees and 
other fruit trees, Bermuda 
grass. 4^  miles west on 
Hwy. 36 817-643-5221 or 
643-7221.

NEED EXTRA CASH for the 
HOUDAYS? World Book- 
Childcraft, Inc. has the 
answer. Join us as either a 
full-time or part-time sales 
representative. Excellent 
com m issions. F le x ib le  
hours. C a ll o r w r ite : 
Maurine H. Mallon, 4033 
Avondale, Abilien, Texas 
79605,91M 73«31.(S-1) T83

NEW FHA approved 2 br. 1 
bath Brick Home. Carpet - 
total elect. 1020 sq ft. 1 car­
port Inside utility room with 
W/D connections. Some ap­
pliances located in nice 
Eastland neighborhood on 
lot approx 70x100 with large 
cedar trees $44,500 C l  
629-1646 after 5 p.m. TF

ORAPHAN HOUSE 
NtEDS HOME

Located in Putman on 
3 lots. 6 rooms and 
utility porch. Garage, 
s to rage  room  and 
chicken coop located 
behind house. Call 
after 5.442-4766. p88

4S. htobila Hornea

INVENTORY CLEARENCE 
Several of our homes have 
been drastically reduced & 
there’s never been a better 
time to save thousands of 
$$$. Check out these prices!

#0449 80X14 3 -2  was
$25,956 now just $21,000.

#3755 80X14 3 -2  was
$23,578 now just $18,.300.

#2010 64X14 2-1 was
$21,837 now just $17,499.

#0939 80X16 3 -2  was
$28,967 now just $22,495.

#1514 72X14 2 -2  was
$23,784 now just $18,799.

#1382 48X28 3 -2  was
$40,610 now just $32,490.
All prices include delivery, 
setup, tie down & central air 
installed and are no trade 
specials. Prices are limited 
to stock homes only. No 
dealers please.
FOUR SEASONS M FG D  

HOUSING
1504 N. Plaza Dr. Granbury, 

Texas
( across from Eckards Drug) 
PH. (817 ) 573-2442 ^

FOR SALE 1973 Lanier 
M obile Home, 14x72, 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, central 
heat and air conditioning, 
unfurnished excep t ap­
pliances, including washer, 
dryer, and dishwasher. 
Located in Eastland County 
and it is to be moved. Call 
after 5:00 p.m. on weekdays 
or on weekends at 
817-629-8474. T84

HAY BALING 
Square or Lg. round 

T.J. Parrish 
442-3874 p-57tfc

Majestic Theatre
Eastland 629-1220

O ne Showing Only Each Evening 

Open 7:30 Show Starts At 7 :50 P 3 I.

Sunday Last Day

YOR
The Hunter 

from the Future

«<as>coijii|ii mi

Fri. Sat. & Sun.

jCoroline's o rising executive. Jock just 
[lost his Job. Jock's going to hove to start 

from the bottom up.

4P

M R , .moM
Sherwood Pfoductioos Preaemi An Aoron Spehinq Produaion 

MICHAEL KEATON TEW GARR MR. MOM'
Also Srorring MARTIN MULL ANN JULIAN CHRISTOPHER UOYD

Cl fl 201h CEN TURY-FOX FILMS

R8LAger Drive-In
TheatreR anger 647-3802

One Showing O n ly  Each Evening 

Open 7:30 Showtime 8 :00  PJR.

Sunday Lost Day

RMf
ISb u I I  c e n w  O M o l U i O  w l f l i  I s u y l i t M «

». >eKAuFESSOH iRWINCOMCV 
f «ven iaaoWA |>i|MBwlH*h Ca>ao>ai>«>«< Ri(istincrE0«:I

Friq Sat, & Sun

C H A R L E S
B R O N S O N

A C O P .  

A KILLER. 
A OEAOLINE.

f û  M id n - l

Í

ns CAIMN M0UI> MC _  ' . w ,
GIRMI tUMUSw..:.«. ''
CIMUGMm$M
. . i i a i m M P S w . ' i i T O i i K m u r
- . l U M U C N I I  M K W rW S T IV tK  G I K U m  B O R i r r i m B  .  N U I M  M S X n .  IM IO M  
. . . C H U M . X O M M  G U M «  w . « o w n  I  M K U M i . « M U N I  « H H n  
W . .P M C M  K Ö N N E « .I M Q  H O «  — . J  I H  IHOarSIM  -  

H U tfM G  & B U M  T 11 s a n a  a
' « OWIUM V TN CMNM CNOW ME

«CtmsCTK«
MM 11 «Mil acesansf #a«S1 IBMI 8BSMM3

Business Services
Chain Link Fencing 

Com m ercial—Resdential—Farm  
Mobile Horn« Set-Ups 

Underpinning-L«v«ling 
Welding-Corrols-Corporls 

Gate Entronces-Small Or Large
Leroy Steinman tf 647-1946

Bookkeeping and Tax Service
TC

Ken Pon’oek
205 E Moin, Ronger, 647-3022 

1 16 North Seaman Eastland 629-8641

INCOME TAX RETURNS 
MONTHLY AND QUARTERLY

REPORTING FOR BUSINESS
Individual. Partnership, and Corporation Tax Returns

Carpet Cleaning
^  Living, D ining &  H all

.CtRPCT CLW IHI»]

•WATER EXTRACTION 
•SPOT REMOVAL 
•DEODORIZING 
•UPHCXSTERY CLEANING

•3 9 ’*
629-2721
•AUTO INTERIORS

CISCO R A D IA T O R  S iR V K E
207 E. 6th (Breckenridge Hwy.) 

Cisco, Texas 817-442-1547
•  ClMonlng-Rodding-RMpoirlng
•  Aoto-Truck-TrEKtor Rodiotora 
B NMw-RMcorMd-RMbuilt Rodiatora-HqatMra
•  Exchong« Rodiotora 
O Auto Goa Tanka Rapairod

Op«n Mondoy-Frlday e 00a.m.-5:30p.m.
O v T  25 YMora ExparlMncM Rodiotor« Arg Qur Busin#««

9

V

-vrm.v.vci: ser vice

629-2251

J & J Air Conditioning;
1201 W . Commerce Eastland

Coll Now & Hove Your Heater Checked Early 

Free EttimoteB
7rr“ ; - ‘ V

toot w am 
C ISC O  TEX A S

SERVICIN G ALL M AJO R BRANDS 
12 Years Expenanre

HA«vE> G HENSON 
Own«r 442-4072 or 442-4947

T-B4

SmaDey Fence Company
647 -3 8 7 3

A  Fence F o r Every Need  

Chain Link— \Nood— InduBtriol— Farm-— 
Decorative— LandBcap«—Wrought Iron—  

B o llpo rkB — Tennis Courts— Dog Runs 
A n d  M ore



DOIT

and SAVE
H & R Lumber & 

Hardware
715 W . M ain Eastland

629-2104

Sunday, Oct. 16, 1983

CAPnTOL
UPDATE
by Jim Parker

Hutton Insulotion

BLOWN IN INSULATir-

B u iw «-iii m s u u m o i
SavesBIown Up Energy Bills

'Biown-in 
Cellulose

•Acoustical Ceilings 
•Fiberglass Batts

FREE jj, I ,
ESTIMATES i c U  

817-725-6683
■r •

FULL THICKNESS 
WALL INSULATION

Sale Every Day
At

Eastland Direct Factory
Outlet Mobile Home Sales

1-20 East 653-2432 
Home 629-2117
Double W ide* &  Single W ide*

FH A  V A &  Convential Financing

M obile Hom e Insurance

Mobile Homes Pulled &  Releveled ^

O m u i i i -
 ̂ 1 Z I

647-1.302

! n r  1

Eastco, Inc.
107-A Main, Ranger 
Bill Griffith-Broker-Pres. Eastco, Inc.
IjirKP lot with 3 bdr . 1 hsth. affordablr C'-3 
Cuatom built, Uakhill suM i' jq q̂ 3 bd . 2 tiath firrplaof R-12 
Fram« home. 2 Bdr . 1 bai soiD backyard K-1 
Vrry nir», 2 bdr . I bath, cormr lut. A.> SOLO'I» '̂HA loan E-2 
N*vr on market, bni k. SOLD 1 3''* baths. lh /A. E-3 
Hwy HO East. 3 bdr , 2 bath, t'H/A. EHA apprai.sed R-1 
Ychuik Addn , 3 Bdr , 1 bath, Asstunable EHA loan, R-2 
BarKain priced. 2 bdr . 1 bath, close to downtown R-3 
Owner finance. 2 bdr . I hath, comer lot R4 
lairKe 2 bdr , 1 bath. CH/A R.&
lake new, bnek, 3 bdr . 2 bath, CH/A. fireplace screened back porch, R.«
Meadnwbrook Addn . 6 bdr . 3 bath, fireplace, basement. R-7 
Bnck. 3 bdr., 1 1/2 bath, one car ijaraKe. fenced backyard C/H, R̂ l 
Completely Remodeled. 3 bdr , 2 I s o l o ' l l * ' ' ' • larne corner lot, R-9 
Just listed. Youn« Addition. 3 bdr . I Datn.priced to sell. R-10 
Eitra nice. 3 bdr . 1 bath, beautifully decorated. CH/A 
Country home. 3 bdr . 1 3/t SCXD 1 fireplaces on 1 acres HA-1 
Beautiful new bnck home 3 bdr . 2 bath. 2 car Karate on 3 9 acres HA-2 
BeauUful country home. 3 SOLD' hath, on i acres. HA-3 
t acres with lots SOLD bility. A^ _
Completely remodeled two bedroon, SOtD gth. bargained pneed Hod«es Oak Park Addition R-11 
MEADOWBROOK ADDITION. 3 bdr., 1 1/2 ball SOLD Fenced backyard Priced to sell R*19 
OAKHIIJ. Sl'BDIVISION-Beautifu soto larite livini! room, dining room-kitchen combinatian. 3 bdr . 2
bath. CH/A large lot. R-13
PINE STREET-Very nice 2 bdr 1 bath, with greenhouse R-lt
Joe Young Addiüon-Recently remodeled, s sq id ' comer lot with fenced backyard R-1Í
ERA assumable loan, large 2 bdr . I bath, ceiling fans, fireplace, garden spot R-16 
BEAirriFUU.Y I^NDSC.APED stucco home. 3 bdr . 1 bath patio deck R-17 
Beautiful home, 3 bdr , 1 1/2 baths, bird house, green house, gas gnll. on 2 * acres HA-t 
Bargain pnred. large comer lot, 3 bdr , 1 bath, with fireplace R-H 
NICE HOME, 3 bdr , 1 bath on approximately 2 acres HA-5 
OIJ3EN. Approximately 2 acres, 3 bdr . 1 1/2 baths HA-i 
STRAWN, .Small 2 bdr . SOLD priced to sell .S-I 
Strawn. 3 bdr . I 3/t baths on 3 lots S-2 

I 41 96S8 acres with large tank slocked with fish, good hunting. A-1 
' 55 acres near new school A-2

I-ake I.eon-2 Bdr . 1 bath on a; SOID nstely 2 acres Owner finance HA-7 
12 X 60 Moiiile Htxne. 3 Bdr , 1>, baths. C/H on 4 lots Priced to sell 
CADDO Texas, Mobile Home - 2 Bdr . 14  baths. CH/A on 0 459 acres 
Asaumable FHA loan, no qualifying. 2 Bdr . I bath C-3 
Owner Finance l̂ Bdr , 1 bath E-*
A Very Attractive Bnck, 3 Bdr . 14 bath, fireplace. CH/A, Privacy Fence on large lot E-7 
OAK HOUOW l.ANE-Exquisite. Bnck. 3 Bdr 24 baths with all the extras E-<

I 3 Bdr , 1 bath Older Home E9 
, 5 acres, cleared with city water A-3 
Hwy 60 Easl-10 acres with 3 bdr , 1 bath home HA-6 
Morton Valley, 12 acres. 3 Bdr , SOLD -ountry home HA-7

OPKIRTCNITY-Hwy H West, Hanger. Well establiahcd Restaurant on 1 23 acres C-9 
LDCATED ON HWY 60 East. Ranger. Completely Remodeled uiaide Restaurant irith good income C-*
Owner Finance 10 41 acres with older home, minerals included HA-0
100 aerea • fenced, water well, stock tank, older home, Hsry frontage, minerals. A-3
Hwy 60 West. Nice 3 Bdr., 1 bath, frame home or 0 24 acres R-17
Energy EfficienL 2 Bdr., 14 bath, CH/A R-18
urrs
Lot at La VXD n-LLl 
COMMERHAI
4600 sq. ft building, some owner finance. C-1 
Good business, ideal ocation on mam m Hanger. C 
Good business, good location In Eastland, C-3 
Hwy 00 West-Good business. C-4

BUSINESSES-Sell on< SOLD all making good money, owner finance, location Ranger, F.aatland k

Shirley Griffith 
647-1635

Charles Arnett 
647-1324

Kenneth Grice 
647-5127

Each Office is Independently Owned and Operated 
I L^rry Armstrong 

629-16S3 Einanci• uiancinif A more ustings available
Century Zi CorporaUon - 5% down

Ray Moody 
72b-77J9 
647-5191

Donna McDonald 
647-1291

As mentioned last week I 
wilt continue giving a brief, 
but hopefully full, concise 
and understandable ex­
planation of the next three 
(3) proposed amendments 
(#4, 5 and 6 ) appearing on 
the November 8th election 
ballot.

P roposition  44 would 
authorize the Legislature to 
enact laws to provide for 
succession of members of 
the Legislature in the event 
of an enemy attack and 
allows for suspension of Con­
stitutional procedural rules 
in the event of, or immediate 
threat of, enemy attack. 
Contingent upon passage of 
this proposition, last session 
the Legislature enacted H.B. 
1216 which sets out the 
specifics for “ emergency in­
terim successors." Should 
the proposition fail, H.B. 
1216 has no effect.

Supporters fee l Texas 
lacks necessary powers 
needed to respond to an at­
tack and that proper civil 
defense planning, of which

G ordon  Spot
C o u n t y  E x t e n i l o n  A g e n l|  

D c M a r q u i t  G o r d o n

this proposition is only a 
small part, would save lives 
and insure continuation of 
our democratic form of 
government. They beleive it 
will strengthen other civil 
defense efforts in Texas and 
they believe that being 
prepared is a responsible 
and sensible direction to 
take. Supporters also say 
almost all states and U.S. 
territories have succession 
laws for state and local of­
ficials. Only three (3) states 
do not provide for legislative 
succession.

Opponents to this proposi­
tion feel a nuclear war would 
be unrestrainable and that 
state government, following 
obliteration of most of the 
population  and m a jo r 
resources, would be un­
necessary and insuppor­
table. They believe it would 
give the Govemer dangerous 
pow ers under the 
“ immediate threat of an 
enemy attack" especially 
since “ immidate threat”  is 
not defined. Opponents also 
feel that this proposition en­
courages the theory that a 
“ limited”  nuclear war is 
possible.

Proposition 45 would allow 
use of the Permanent School 
Fund (PS F ) to guarntee 
bonds issued by school 
districts. The PSF program 
is made up od income mainly 
from grazing and oil leases 
and royalties from state land 
and is constitutionally set 
aside to support public 
schools. This money is in­
vested in government and 
corporated securities and in­
teres t from  these in ­
vestments, plus money from 
certain taxes, make up the 
ASF which is distrubuted to 
school districts each year 
through the Foundation 
School Fund going mainly 
fo r  em p loyee  pay, 
maintenance, and operating 
expenses of the schools. The 
Constitution bars use of the 
PSF of ASF for anything 
other than support of public 
schools.

Supporters say a bond- 
guarntee program would im­
prove school districts’ bond 
rating thus saving them 
money on interest on bonds 
necessary for school con­
struction. S.B. 384, which is 
contingent on passage of this 
proposition, a llow s the 
guarntee of school bonds on­
ly for construction, equip­
ment or site acquisition. On­
ly up to two (2 ) times the 
value of the securities ac­
quired or interest earned 
from the PSF, excluding real 
es ta te , can be bond- 
guamteed.

Opponents say that if 
Texas uses the PSF to guarn­
tee school district bonds, it 
shoud be prepared to spend 
part of the bond in the event 
of a default since, for the 
state to get its money back 
from a defaulting school 
district by reducing state 
money due that district in 
the future, as proposed 
would be harmful to the 
school children of that 
district.

Proposition 46 allows the 
garnishment of wages to pro­
vide child support.

Supporters feel garnish­
ment will benefit Texas by 
removing many families 
from welfare rolls. D.H.R. 
figures indicate that of the 
child support cases under 
their jurisdiction, over 70 
percent of the parents fail to 
pay up. The beleive Texas 
lacks adequate tools to force 
payment. Right now their 
options are either to put the 
parent failing to pay child 
support on probation or in 
jail orrender a judgement on 
the debt, which to be en­
forceable. takes time and 
money. Supporters say

Blown in cellulose 
Fiberglass bath 

Arcoustical ceilings 
Free estimates 

817-725-6683. 74-tfc

Three Eastland County 
men won four championship 
plaques at the 1 1 th annual 
Eastland County Hay Show 
Oct. 4. R.D. Hart of Eastland

Texas is 46th in ranking of its 
enforcement policy showing 
its effectiveness.

Opponents believe that 
Texas’ long tradition of 
leagally protecting a wage 
earner’s paycheck from  
creditors will seek other ex­
ceptions to the ban on gar­
nishment. They believe gar­
nishment is an intrusion into 
the lives of citizens resulting 
in employers being made 
aware that an employee is 
divorced or has an out-of- 
wedlock child. They say 
em p loyers  could
d isc r im in a te  aga in st 
employees because of this 
knowledge. Because of the 
administrative bother for 
employers, opponents feel 
they may hesitate of hire or 
retain workers under the 
garnishment would be inef­
fective against debtors who 
are self-emplyed or who are 
paid in cash.

Let me apologize again for 
the “ d ry" article but, please 
keep in mind the importance 
of your informed vote. Let us 
know if you want additional 
information on any of the 
proposed amendem ents. 
Next week I plan to explain 
the propositions 7, 8 , and 9.

Hope to see you then.

re ce iv ed  the cham pion 
coastal bermuda grass 
award and the champion oat 
hay award. His coastal bale 
contained 13.06{ percent pro­
tein and scored 96 of a possi­
ble 100 score. The bale of oat 
hay tested 12.19 percent pro­
tein with a total score of 97.

Dr. L.R. Gohlke of Ranger 
was producer of the cham­
pion sorghum-sudan hybird 
bale. His hay tested 10.12 
percent protein and received 
a score of 84.

The champion of other 
Perennials was a bale of 
Klein grass owned by C&D 
Feed Store of Eastland. The 
bale tested 13.12 percent of 
protein with a total score of 
92.

Extension Agronom ist, 
Dr. George Alston judged 
the 32 bales of hay in the 
County show held at the 
county livestock show bams. 
The final score is determin­
ed by the protein and the 
physecal qualities of the hay.

Other entries winning blue 
ribbons because they scored 
85 or above were N.E. 
Richardson, Melvin Adams, 
M .O. U nderw ood, and 
Robert Donovan.

The entries that score 
from 70 to 85 were awarded 
red ribbons. These ex ­
hibitors were N.E. Richard­
son, Danny Meroney, John 
Blair, Mathew Housson, Dr. 
L.R. Gohlke, J.D. Carter, 
John Kidd, F.L. Spurlen, 
B&S Cattle Co. Gerald Bint, 
W.W. Wilson and Dr. Gohlke.

White ribbon winners were 
D.J. West, James Gardner, 
C&D Feed Store, M.O. 
Underwood, Truman Fam- 
brough. Bill Horn, Pete 
Hathcock, Lon Carmack, 
K.F. Kirk, Dale Spurlen, and 
John Hathcock.

The hay show was planned 
and conducted by the county 
livestock and forage com­
mittee. Sponsors for the 
show were Richardson Feed 
Co. of Ranger, Thornton 
Feed Mill Inc. of Cisco, Car­
bon Farm Supply of Carbon,

Pioneer Farm er’s Co-Op of 
Pioneer, Wenfrey Feed and 
Peanut Co. of Rising Star, 
C&D Feed Store of Ea.stiand, 
and Texas Plant Food In­
stitute.

County Agent De Gordon 
said the hay shows have 
helped producers to know 
how to produce better quali­
ty hay. Hay is an important 
crop in Eastland County and 
its quality is very important 
to livestock men who are try­
ing to trim the cost of 
livestock production.

Jox Electric
Rttidtiifial • Commercial 

New Service InstaMotiens; RewM ig, 
Breaker Pooeb Moved or Repbeed; New 

Rooge, Drier, Washer Hookups, etc.
Col Jock Toyler 647-5390

CATTLE
FOR

SALE
CROSS TIMBERS 

POLLED HEREFORD 
ASSOCIATION 
ANNUAL SALE 

SATURDAY, OCT. 15 
12:30 p.m.

H am ilton  L ives tock  
C om m iss ion  

H am ilton , T e x a s  
M  tierd  bulls, 35 fem a les  
t o r  in form ation , con ta c t 

T e x a s  P o lled  H ere fo rd  Assn. 
817/ 373-2524 T-80

James W. Ratliff Realtor-Broker
111 E. Main St. Ranger, Texa8 

Office 647-1260 Home Phone 647-1667Ranger
One of the nicer homes in Ranger. Brick, central 

heat & air, on comer lots, three full baths, two large 
bedrooms, large den, living room, separate dining 
room, two storage buildings, beautiful yard with lots of 
pecan trees and red oaks. This is one of the nicer homes 
in Ranger.

Beautiful three bedroom, IV4 baths, green house, 
large den, very attractive yard, central heat and air. 
This house is on 2.6 acres of land.

Oak Hill Addition, Brick, three bedrooms, 2 baths, 
woodburning fireplace, large study. Will FHA.

Large spacious home with three bedrooms upstairs, 
two bedrooms, 1 bath downstairs, living room, dining 
room and garage. Close to down town.

Three bedrooms, one bath, living room, very nice kit­
chen with lots of cabinet space, dishwasher, range, 
three car garage, cellar, eight pecan trees. This place 
is on 2 acres of land. $35,000.

Three bedrooms, brick, Oak Hill Addition, two baths. 
Will FHA. This is a nice new home.

Two Bedrooms, one bath, dishwasher, range, 
refrigerator, Franklin wood Stove, one Window unit 
refrigeration. Vented heater in living room, cellar in 
back yard garden spot, fruit trees. This home is in ex­
cellent condition. Will FHA.

Business Property Ranger.

Two story brick building on Main Street with appart- 
ments upstairs and place for business on the ground 
floor. $25,000.
OUT OF EAS’TLAND

4 4

Just out of City limits AVt acres of land, no im­
provements. $10 ,000.00 * ,

OUT OF GORMAN

195 acres of land in Comanche County. About one- 
half in cultivation and Coastal, the other half in native 
pasture.

LAKE LEON

Very nice two bedrooms, three baths, large living 
room, game room, screened back porch, two storage 
buildings, garage, carport, fenced front yard. This 
place is on a deeded lot on the better part of lake.

Large lake house with three bedrooms, large kit­
chen, livingroom with make down beds, guest house 
with several bunk beds, all the furniture goes with this 
house.

16 lots just off of Lake I^on. These lots are 100 X 200.

* J o ù ) n ,  &
CoutfÎtŸ"

RlAl ISTATl

LARBARA LOVE, INC.
BRO-ER

H IG H W A Y  BO  E A S T  
E A S T L A N D  T E X A S  7 6 4 4 8

629-8391 629-1725
EASTLAND

NEAR SCH001.S- 4 bdr. 1*2 baths on 2 lots. El 
ASSUMABLE LOAN, I^rge 3 bdr., 2 baths.E3 
FANTASTIC DEAL 3 bd, 2 B frame. Cent. H/a.E2 
ASSUME FHA No qualifying, 3 bd. 1 bath cen. H/A.E5 
CHARMING 2 STORY 4 bdr beautifully decorated.E6 
LARGE 2 bdr., H/A, corner fenced. Assume FHA.E7 
EXCEPTIONAL BRICK HOME, Pool, Guest House.EO 
3 BDR. 1 B to be remodeled. Owner finance.ElO 
70'X105 Corner Lot, Utilties available.E15 
EXTRA NICE 2 bdr., cent. H/A, new kitchen.El?
BRICK 3 Br., 1̂ 4 bath, 2 living area, patio.E12 
LARGE LOT, 3 bdr., 1 b.. frame, lots Of extras.E13 
NEAR SCHtKUis older 3 bdr frame-lots storage.E16 
NICE OLOER-2 bdr., cent. H/A, new kitchen.El? 
ENERGY EFF'ICIENT new metal frame 2 bdr. home. 
NEW HOMES UNDER CONSTRUCTION, Call for 
details.
CU)SE TO SCHOOLS, 3 bdr I ’ t bath, nice house.E20 
PRICED RIGHT, 2 bdr., 1 S O LD eds repainted.E21 
BRICK 3 bdr., 1*2 ba.. Will trade for U k e  Leon.E22 
OLDER 3 bdr.. Double garage, trees, good area.E23 
3 BDR., 1*2 Bath Bnck, Assumable 235 Loan.E4 
3 BDR., 2 B, Frame older home. Good location.E8 
PRICE REDUCED- 4 bdr., 3 bath, extras.E14 
NEW UNIQUE 1*2 story rock in Oakhollow.E18 
ATTRACTICE LARGE 2 bd. 1 B large wooded lot.E21 
EXCELLENT BRICK HOME in prime location.E25 

U I  I I E A
CISCO F rame, 3 bd. 1 B garage, large lot trees.dlS 
RANGF7R I.arger 2 bdr., cellar, corner lot nice nice.01 
1*2 STORY I.AKE HOUSE 3 bdr., 3 bath leased lot.02 

PEGGYE SWAFFOW) HAZEL UNDERWCXiD
6471050 629 1188

Moving to Eastland County? or anywhere in U S A (]all 
Toll Free 1-80(W2541910 Ext. 4365 for information' (No

GORMAN-ROCK HOME over 1 ac. lot. 03 
1.AKE LEON 3 Br, l */2 B, Mobile Home, good water.04 
RISING STAR, 1900’s home needs TLC, on 8 Ac.05 
CARBON BRAND NEW, Cent. H/A, large lot.06 
CISCO ASSUMBLE 1 Yr. old 3 bdr. 2 B.014 
LAKE LEON, 3 bdr., 2 baths, on 2 deeded lots.07 
OLDEN, 2-3 Br., 1 B., Lg. fenced lot, carport.08 
RANGER ASSUMEABLE, 3 Br 2 B Cent H/A extras.09 
CISCO OWNER FINANCE, 2 Br. 2*  ̂ lots. Appliance. 
CARBON, 2 Br., 754completed, you finish & Save.Oll 
CISCO Brick 5 yr. SOLD ith, many extras.012 
WAIJC TO SCHOOLCISCO, 4 bd. 2 B, shop & office 
space.016 HOUSE AND ACREAGE
CISCO 279 Ac. 2B House, 4 B tanks-pasture- 
minerals.HA3
CISCO 2B Home 1 yr. fireplace-2B-Library-W/AC.HA4 
CISCO- COUNTRY PACKAGE 2 homes on 160 Ac. 
minerals.HA7
HOME IN COUNTRY 12.9 Ac., Coastal, 3 br. 1B.HA8 
ACRES 2 bdr. home with hou.se and barns.HA5 
CROSS PLAINS: 116 ac., custom brick home.HAll 
CISCO 4 bdr., 2*'i bath home on 10 acres.HA15 

*tras^?A2 WIDE on one acre. Many ex-

428 ACREl oU LD Jisco  hunting, minerals.A1 
SMALL tracts so. of city building sites.A4 
100 ACRES, good coastal, barns, corrals, 3 tanks.AS 
12*2 AC Near l^ke ¡.eon on pavements, staff water.A?
60 ACRES, NW of Cisco, Rd. frontage on 2 sides.AS 
167*2 Ac. 70 Ac. field, rest pasture, tanks, well.AU
30.87 Ac. 700 Ac. field, rest pasture, tanks well.AU
30.87 Ac. on F'm 571 So of I,ake Leon, trees.A15 
RISING STAR, 8 ac., w/older home, owner carry.A17 
146 Ac. on Highway, Trees, lots of quail.A9
55*2 Ac on HWY 101 near Ranger. Trees & quail AlO

C u M w IE f i .c iA L
3 RENTALS large lots, fenced garage.C3 
OFF'ICE BLDG., 2 lots on Commerce St.C4 
HWY 80 E near 1-20, large bldg. / ac.C5 
PRICED REDUCED office or Retail. Main Street.C6 
GORMAN Hwy. 6 Frontage-Cafe & Metal Building.C9

BARBARA LOVE 
647-1397

ROGER AUTRY 
44^3345

ELMER FOSTER 
629-1972

k



Bananas
3  C ^ F o r

$ 1 0 0

PRODUCE KRAFT] HARVEST JAMBOREE
Fresh Green ^
Onions

I Fresh Green ^
Cabboge 4  ' 1
Texos Ruhy Red ^
Grapefruit 3  «» 1̂

BAKERY
2 Layer White t w o
Coke ’ 3 * ’
Petite Qnnamon a h .

Rolls » <• OO^
[Ranger or Sugar _  _

_______9 9
I

Boneless Round
Steak

$ ] 7 8

Tenderized Round «
Steak I

Quarter Sliced ,  m»
Pork Loin 1 ^  fc

Small Leon Pork
Spare Ribs ^1 k
Pilgrim Pride

E L I

Bounty
Towels

Jelio
Gelatin

Prime Parts
Gooch
Bacon »1»’ .

Breakfast Special 9 9 *
Jumbo Rol Colgate

iScrombled Eggs, Bacon, Hash 
Browns, Gravy, Biscuits Van Camp Shaving Cream ■ »<«■

[T.V. Orange
Juice ” "•

M rs. Smith

Pork & 9 For Final Net e A M
Hair SprayBeans

Pumpkin P ie  u 
Birdseye Cob $ | 1 9
Corn 4 Ear Pock I

Delsey

Tissue
Cor
T V .
Biscuits

Kleenex Focial
Tissue

280 ct.

Colgate TwkiPock $ 0 1 9
6.4 oz. "

For
DOUBLE COUPONS 

7  DAYS

Toothpaste
Pompers convenience C a o O

Diapers ^ 8 **
PARKER FLORIST

Fresh Carnations
Blue Bonnet 3 9 *
Maraarine I». qtrs

BRING IN ANY NUMBER OF MANUFACTURER' S CENTS OFF COUPONS 
AND WE'LL DOUBLE YOUR SAVINGS. OFFER EXCLUDES RETAILER OR 

FREE COUPONS, CIGARETTES OR TOBACCO COUPONS, OR REFUND 
CERTIFICATES. COUPON VALUE CANNOT EXCEED THE VALUE OF 

THE ITEM LIMIT RIGHTS RESERVED.
2 - « » l

I
Pioneer Baking light C rus t

Sunday, Oct. 16, 1983

26 CJCers

Selected To

Who’s Who
The 1984 edition of WHO'S 

WHO AMONG STUDENTS 
IN AM ERICAN JUNIOR 
COLLEGERS will include the 
names of 26 students from 
Cisco Junior College who 
have been selected as na­
tional outstanding campus 
leaders

Campus nominating com- 
iiuttees and editors of the an­
nual directory have included 
the names of these students 
based on their academic 
acheivement, service to the 
community, leadership in 
extracurricular activities 
and potential for continued 
success.

Outstanding students have 
been honored m the annual 
directory since it was first 
published in 1934.

Students named this year 
from Cisco Junior College 
a re : M elv in  M odesty, 
Austin; Julia PMorence, 
Blanket; Ruth Hill, Boyd; 
Pam Lykins, Breckenridge; 
Bruce Barnes, Carol 
Endeb: -ck, Karen Harwell, 
C ladean K in ser, D elia  
Ixipez, Becky Thompson, 
and Eloise Torres of Cisco; 
l.«onard Garces and Mary 
Watson of Eastland; David 
Noll, Falls City; Deanna 
Ixipez, Ft. Worth; Linda 
Bubert, Hamilton; I,aney 
Oliver, Jacksboro; Franz 

* Patterson, Killeen; Kelle 
Burnett, Brad Butler, Nancy 
Click Butler, and Mary 
Fariello of Merkel; Terry 
Bean, Cross Plains; Regina 
Rust, Rising Star; John 
Blankenship, Sonora; and 
Sherri l.«wallen of Wheeler.

4-H Teaches

Horsemanship
For youngsters who want 

to learn to ride and care for 
horses, the 4-H horse pro­
gram has all the ingredients.

More than 10,200 4-H’ers 
between the ages of 9 and 19 
are enrolled in the horse pro­
gram conducted by the 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, Texas ABcM 
University System.

Members can participate 
in a series of projects and 
are involved in hundreds of 
loca l even ts  includ ing 
meetings, farm tours, trail 
rides, shows, parades and 
clinics.

It is not necessary to own a 
horse to be active in the 4-H 
horse program, says John 
Blair, county Extension 4-H 
program coordinator.

The horse program, which 
is led by volunteers and coor­
dinated by Extension staff, 
provides an opportunity for 
4-H members to participate 
in many exciting events, a 
major one being the annual 
State 4-H Horse Show, a five- 
day event each July. Youth 
can also compete in horse 
ju dg in g  and horse 
demonstrations, with the 
final objective being State 
4-H Roundup each June at 
Texas A&M University.

Youth in the program also 
use their skills to help 
others. Many conduct pro­
grams to help the handicap­
ped enjoy riding and learn 
about these horses and 
ponies.

Youth who excel in the 4-H 
horse program can qualify 
for numerous awards spon­
sored by the American 
Quarter Horse Association, 
Texas 4-H Foundation and 
the Insurance Company of 
North America.
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Mary Carey Will Give Local Review 

Of ’How Long Must I Hide’ Oct. 19
by Viola Payne

Mary Carey of Cisco and 
Willow, Alaska will review 
her new book “ How Long 
Must I H ide" at 8;00 p.m., 
Wednesday, October 19, in 
the F irst National Bank 
Community Room, Cisco.

The Cisco Writer’s Club, 
sponsor of the event, cordial­
ly invites the public to attend 
the R ev iew  and the 
Autograph Party which will 
follow.

“ How Long Must I Hide", 
published by Eakin Press, 
Austin, is receiving wide 
media attention m Texas and 
elsewhere It is cited as a 
compelling account of two 
years Mrs Carey spent with 
her first husband, “ Roy” 
after his prison-break in 
F.ast Texas in 1938.

Will Wilson, former At­
torney General of Texas, 
says in his foreword to the 
book- “ This IS a great and

true love story. All the in^e- 
dients are here-youth blind­
ed by faith, courage, hope 
and ambition... danger and 
adventure-an unavoidable 
and dominating fate working 
against the lovers.

"There is misguided loyal­
ty and then disgrace, family 
rejection and finally disillu­
sionment. Throughout the 
story there is an overriding 
foreboding of tragedy.

“ In the end, after love has 
burned itself out, Mary 
Carey played an active part 
in the righting of wrongs-”

Mrs. Carey dedicates the 
book: “ To the Underdog. If 
reading this book keeps one 
person from committing 
suicide, great is its success”

This book was painful and 
costly for the author to live, 
and possibly to w rite. 
Readers will find a strange 
unmediacy about it-a wrestl­
ing w ith v io len ce  and

Friend
To

Friend
by Jim Hatcher 

Ckoo Church of Christ

Surely no one would con­
tradict the fact that we live 
in a highly technical, cold, 
Indiiierent world.

John Powell in his book, A 
Reason to Live! A Reason to 
D ie!, states, “ The most 
tragic paradox of our times 
is this: Man is discovering so 
much of his world that he is 
losing meaningful contact 
with it."

We see the loss of this 
meaningful contact on every 
hand. If we want to be enter­
tained. we need no friends. 
We simply turn on the televi­
sion and hope that no one In­
terrupts us.

If our children want to 
play games, it no longer In­
volves friendship or im­
agination. They entertain 
them selves with ready 
made, cold. Indifferent elec­
tronic toys.
r r m M T m n T T r r r t j  
\ C b fM K t M m ir a K t  

aittti a 9Ut PhrtCi

Certainly progress and 
technology are wonderful. 
Who would want to go back 
to the horse and buggy days? 
But success has created a 
friendship problem. We have 
become isolated from peo­
ple. The wise man in God’s 
Word reminds us, “ A man 
that hath friends must show 
himself friendly" (Proverbs 
18:24).

Yes. everyon e wants 
friends, but it is a two-way 
street. To have friends we 
must put forth the effort to 
cultivate friendships.

It is my prayer that, 
through this article, we can 
become friends. But do not 
let it end with reading the 
words of this article each 
week.

If at any time I can be of 
service to you or your fami­
ly, please feel free to call on 
me AS A FREIND.

See you next week.

sometimes unresolved con­
flict. With its local and 
southwestern setting, it is 
certain to attract particular 
interest here.

But it will go far beyond 
that. For although its time- 
frame is in the 1930’s, it 
seems as current as today’s 
newspapers As current, in­
deed, as love, danger, terri­
ble choices, power and lust 
in high places, prison cor­
ruption, poverty and pain 
and guilt. For these are 
some of the realities of life in 
any age

The account of Mary’s ex­
periences begins on a day in 
August, 1938, when she 
decides to leave her job as a 
reporter with the Abilene 
Reporter-News and help her 
husband after his escape 
from prison. While hiding 
and running with him toward 
California, she realizes the 
immense gulf between them.

“ The man I loved was sud­
denly a stranger to me,”  she 
says. “ I shrank from him. 
He was eaten by hatred for 
the w hole w orld  and 
everybody in it. He seemed 
d is in teres ted  in the 
future...the future happiness 
that I wanted for us.”

She lived in that situation 
until 1940, meeting enough 
perils to last her for a long 
while The dark side of life, 
for her, meant eating raw 
rattlesnake on the desert, 
hopping freights, surviving 
at various jobs, facing 
almost constant danger, and 
fin a lly  con tem p la ting  
suicide.

“ I found I had built my 
house on sand,”  she says

Fortunately, for herself, 
her family, and for many 
who have known her since, 
Mary was able to turn her 
life around. Her message to 
her parents, when finally 
deciding to make the break, 
was: “ I ’ m taking the 
straight way home, im­
mediately, non-stop.”

And to others, who might 
be in the middle of their won 
1983 choices, she says; 
“ Watch your own excuses 
for breaking the laws of God 
and man. Know when to quit.
I never did.”

Mrs. Carey eyentually 
divorced the “ Roy”  of “ How 
liOng Must T Hide’*'.'He was

Quality • Snapshots]; 
Cameras & Supplies! 

Films-AII sizes  ̂
And of Course 

Fine Photoqraphy 

Is Our Business.

conoN's
STUDIO

Open
Tuesday, October 18

Brenda 'N Friends
2110 Beech

I Beouticians: Audrey Grice Efizabeth Lee 
A Brenda Wifingham

442-4481 P83

M arvallee’s Dress Shop

611 K. Kih Open l.iseo. Texan

Knit Pants
Silt 6 20

Silt 32 52 $ J 9 5

Fall Blouses
f p 9 5 . $ J ^ 9 5

Girls Tops
S ^ 9 5 . $ J Q 9 5

Jeans
Dresses
Silt 3-241^

Some Summer 
Items Drastically 

Reduced
Tops ^6’ *
B  a  ^C O OEaaiL.

Sweater Tops
$ 7 9 5  .  $ ß 9 5

Uniform
Dresses
» IJ W

Pant Suits

$ 2 P >
Jackets

Auf. Cohrs 
S-/H4

$ 2 3 9 5

Jeans
Jr. & Missy

M 2 ”  

5 1 4 «Silt 32M

Skirts
Silt S IS

Maternity
Tops 

Pants

Jeans M 2 «  
Dresses

$2 j ’ 5 .^ 24’ *

returned to prison-she work­
ed for prison reform. She 
remarried, and happily. In 
1962 her second husband. 
Richard Carey, died, and she 
moved to Alaska.

Other books Mrs. Carey 
has written are: "Alaska, 
Not F o r  A W om an ,’ ’ 
“ F irew eed  Philosophy’ ’ , 
“ Let’s Taste Alaska” , and 
"Green Gold in Alaska" 
Between writing and other 
enterprises she often returns 
to her home town of Cisco, 
where she visits with her 
sistes L.«la I.atch Lloyd and 
Annie Rendall.

Through her life  ex ­
periences as well as the in­
tensely personal “ How I»n g  
Must 1 Hide”  Mary Carey 
emerges as one who has 
never been afraid to risk or 
feel emotion. Some people go 
through life trying to do 
neither.

Band Boosters 

Will Be Selling 

Pizza Kits
The Band Boosters of 

Cisco will be selling pizza 
kits again. This kit includes 6 
pizzas, either cheese, pep- 
peroni, or sausage, at a price 
of $14.95 per kit. This 
averages $2.49 for a 12 inch 
pizza. They are delivered 
fresh and can then be frozen.

The money made from this 
project is used to help spon­
sor Band activities. This 
year we have approximately 
225 students enrolled in Band 
from 6th grade thru High 
School We should be very 
proud of all these kids.

The next order will go in 
Oct. 17,1983 and be delivered 
to the High School the week 
of Oct. 24, 1983.

If you haven’t tried these 
pizzas we urge you to try 
them and help support the 
bands. In the near future we 
will also be offering a Mex­
ican Food Kit at the same 
price, hopefully, with the 
December shipment.

If you haven’t already 
been contacted please call: 
La N e lle  Anderson  at 
442-2752 day or 442-2011 at 
night.

Shower Set
There will be a come and 

go wedding shower in honor 
of Mike and Cindy (Riggs) 
McGough on Saturday, Oc­
tober 15, from 2:00 - 4:00 
p.m. at 306 W. 4th. All friends 
and family are invited.

Roof Garden Will 
Open October 17

The opening production of 
the 1983^ season at the Roof 
Garden Dinner Theatre in 
C isco w ill be John 
Steinbeck's classic drama 
OF MICE AND MEN. This is 
a tremendously moving 
story about two roving far­
mhands during the I930’s, 
one of who unwittingly 
m urders a wom an. 
Ultimately it is a story about 
brotherly love in a cruel and 
indifferent world.

Lobo Booster 

Club Holds 

Meeting Get. 11
The Lobo Booster Club 

met at 7; 30 at the Cisco High 
School library on Tuesday, 
October 11, for the regular 
meeting.

The following individuals 
and or businesses were add­
ed to the list of Lobo 
Boosters.

Dr. M. Allen McGinness 
and family, J.C. Penny Co., 
Russell Newman Mfg. Inc., 
Kimbrough Funeral Home, 
E.B. Mott Co., Batteas 
Builders, Lee Kinard family, 
Ted McCollock, Lloyd Ixm- 
don, Ed Stuart Family, Bob­
by W. Smith family. Bob 
FTickett, Manning & Martha 
Davis, Benny Gary family, 
Bruce Speegle, Bob Qualls, 
Major & Dorothy Farn­
sworth, Stanley P ir tle , 
Gaude H. Yeager, Charles & 
Jean Jessup, Carl Kleiner 
and Gail Batteas.

A1 Anderson , L loyd  
M cG rew  and G lenn 
Ferguson each have lifetime 
memberships.

The G sco Press
Sunday,

October 16, 1983

'• Alto Havt lingerie i  Baby Gifts

M & M TEXACO
Jntroducts Window Tinting A Glass Etching
along with Custom Pin Striping. Pleose coll 
for Appointment. Not to Mention Our FuH 
line of Americon Rocing Wheeb A 

accessories. B.F.Goodrich tires too.
442-3556 D.S7 24 hr. W rocke^

C a r p  T o u r n e y  

I s  S e t  O c t .  2 2 - 2 3
The last Carp Tournament 

of the year will be held 
Satu rday, O ctober 22 
through Sunday, October 23 
at I^ke Cisco. The tourna­
ment is sponsored by Cisco 
Pump and En Re Corpora­
tion. Everyone is invited to 
enter.

First place will receive 
50% of the pot, second place 
30%, and third place 20%. 
F irs t  p lace p r ize  is

estimated to be about $300. 
Other prizes to be awanled 
are a Calcutta, and a $10 
prize for the smallest carp 
caught.

Weigh in will be at the 
“ Point” . Entries can be ob­
tained at Cisco Pump and 
EnRe Corp. The large tur­
nout from the past tour­
naments is appreciated and 
a larger participation is ex­
pected for this tournament.

Calvary Baptist Church 
Plans Groundhreaking

ig h t •ouni
U Quality •  Experitne* •  Service

903 E Walker 
Breckenndt’e TX 76024 
(817) 559-8441

Complete Satellite 
Systems

V

-.4^'

/ O '

505 Conrad Hilton 
C i s c o . TX 76437 

(817) 442-4131

7i

’X
Li* ■

Complete 10 ft. satellite TV system 
with KLM Sky Eye V reciver

IncijOes »•' )0'l ' t)e,gias5 g.jr arren-x * ir LNA SuPDOf!
• o'o' ■" > slool afia poi«' KlM S«y Eye V 'ece^v*'
ATiOi'ca t 2C LSA a"3 Scaior 'eea ''9'"  Tee aeteeea B'ea«-, 
floyyr .etc 4 p eces 'O' seppi-; I's 'jjgea  pea- niouei aa 
lusts 'Of ai.muir aea e'e.a'ioe Tee SXy Eve V fecewer 
teatu'es segie coe.e'S'Oe c 'Cu-i'y SAW » ne' va' ah'e au9'0 
lue.ng a'd co"'es *  t- a Jf*''Coeve'ie' Opioeai nr 
feoduiaio' a.a'iap'e Sta o' 'eed -'O''- 'O' I'ep'Ovea jar L6A 
ey'ens.oe tubes nciuded

$ A  Q Q C  Package No. 2
^ ' 7 , 7 ^  Price InitalledP-89

Three preview  perfor­
mances (show only) will be 
given on Monday, Tuesday 
and Wednesday nights Oc­
tober 17-19 beginning at 7:30 
p.m. primarily for the stu­
dent audiences with CJC 
tickets at SI 00 and all other 
tickets at $4.00. Dinner 
Theatre performances will 
be held Thursday and Friday 
nights October ^  and 21 with 
dinner served at 7 p.m. 
Tickets are $8.00 regular ad­
mission, $7.00 CJC student 
admission.

|Bo^ Tickets! 
Are On Sale |
Tickets for the Lions 

Benefit Bowl football game 
that will be played Saturday 
n igh t, Oct. 22, in 
Breckenridge between Cisco 
and Ranger Junior Colleges 
are on sale by all members 
of the Uons Gubs here.

Tickets bought in Cisco 
prior to the game are $3 for 
adults and $1 for students. 
The tickets will cost 50 cents 
more if purchased at the 
gate. Tickets may be pur­
chased at The Cisco Press of­
fice.

Parents Day 
Set At CJC 
October 29

Saturday, October 29, will 
be Parents Day on the Cisco 
Junior College campus. 
Parents Day 1983 salutes the 
many fam ilies who are 
represented at CJC.

The day’s activities wiU 
begin with registration from 
10:00 to 11:30 in the Maner 
Memorial Library. College 
dormitories will hold open 
house also from 10-11:30.

A barbecue luncheon will 
be served from 11:30 to 1:00 
in the Corral Room of the 
laguna Hotel for all Parents 
attending. An afternoon foot­
ball game between CJC and 
Baptist Christian College 
will begin with the pre-game 
.show at 1:40 and kickoff at 
2:00.

Calvary Baptist Church 
will have a groundbreaking 
ceremony for their new 
auditorium on Sunday, Oc­
tober 16, at 3:00 p.m., on the 
parking lot north of the pre­
sent auditorium. The church 
is outgrowing its facilities 
and has had to utilize metal 
buildings for Sunday School 
space. P lan s include

rem odeling the present 
auditorium to provide add- 
tional fellowship and educa­
tional space. The men of the 
church will be doing the 
work themselves with a 
target completion date for 
the summer of 1964. Ronnie 
Shackleford is pastor of the 
church and Wayne Webb is 
chaiiman of deacons.

C J C  E n r o l l m e n t  

A t  R e c o r d  H i g h
Cisco Junior College has 

an all-time record 1,804 
students enrolled for the 
1983-84 fall semester. Dr. 
Norman Wallace reported to 
the Board of Regents at their 
monthly meeting last Mon­
day night.

'The num ber o f fu ll 
students on the Cisco cam­
pus totalled 714. Enrollment 
in Abilene amounted to 716 
students, and this number in­
cluded several hundred part- 
time students. Enrolled at 
the Clyde campus were 346 
students. The nursing pro­
gram included 13 students at 
Ballinger and 15 at Graham.

Dr. Wallace noted that the 
growing enrollment picture 
was evidence that the com­
munity college concept was 
growing in popularity “ and 
we feel that it is an endorse­
ment of the quality of educa­
tion being offered.”

In other action, the board 
accepted a bid-of* the Bell 
and Howell company for 
three motion picture projeo

Witches Stew 
Supper Planned 

In Nimrod
Nimrod Neighbors Pro­

gressive Gub will have a 
Witches Stew Supper, Mon­
day, October 24, at 7:00 p.m. 
in the Nimrod Club House.

The charge will be one can 
of “ something”  to go into the 
stew  and a dessert. 
Everyone is welcome. Music 
will be provided.

uUNr mm,
u v a w n i t

Fred Wheeler Construction
Now Homes, Room Additions, Borns, 

Garages, Floor Covering, Tile, 
Sheet Rock, Cabinets.
House Levellinp;

WE DO IT ALL! 
442-1370

P84

1981 Bukk Regal Limited, Loaded, <5795 
1979 CodiHoc, *5795

1981 Ford EKort, Air, Auto., *2450
1981 Ford Tractor. One Gush Hog, *4795
1982 Pontioc, T1000, 17,ooo mb., *3950

10 Pickups to Oiooto from '77-'81 

7 Room House on Avo. F For Sab

1-20 Motors

Floyd - Pee Wee Johnson

W. 19th -1-20
Qsco

442-2161

tors. The low bid of three 
submitted was |2,0M. Dr. 
Wallace said the projectors 
would be used to show educa­
tional films in class rooms 
throughout the school 
system.

Other routine matters 
were considered by the 
board.

l8t Chrisdan 
Church Plans 

Book Review
You are invited to the First 

Christian <3hurch at 2:00 
p.m., October 23, 1983, to 
hear a book review - “ The 
Bronze Bow”  by Elizabeth 
George Speare, to be given 
by Leila Hawari.

The book review will be 
followed with religious sing­
ing by the Bradford Sisters.

After the program, there 
‘ will b e ‘ a tea held in the 
 ̂F e llo w ^ p  Hall honoring the 
young ladies.

Please bring a friend with 
you.

C.W.F.
First Christian Church

Baritone Sings 

At Lions Meet
A program of sacred and 

inspirational music was 
p resen ted  by John 
Picklesimmer, baritone, as 
the entertainment at the 
weekly luncheon of the Cisco 
Lions Gub last Wednesday 
noon at the Colony 
Restaurant.

Mr. Fhcklesimmer, music 
and education director at the 
First Baptist Church, was 
accompanied at the piano by 
Miss Tracey Couch, the 
club’s sweetheart. Bob Con­
ner, program chairman, in­
troduced Mr. Picklesimmer.

C.B. Dill, club president, 
reported that net profits 
from the recent Lions Fish 
Fry amounted to about $400. 
This money, he added w ^  go 
into the club’s fund for use in 
community [wojects.

Secretary Jasper Cook 
said that tickets are being 
sold by all Lions for the an­
nual Lions Benefit Bowl foot­
ball game that will be played 
Saturday night, October 22, 
between Cisco and Ranger 
Junior C o lleg es  in 
Breckenridge.

Smith Team  

Win8 Tourney
A score of 60 -  eight under 

par -  won top honors for the 
Carrel S m i^  team in a 
scrabble golf tournament 
last Saturday afternoon at 
the Cisco Country Club.

Second place went to the 
Maryann Perry team with a 
score of 63, and the Bennie 
Nichols team won third after 
a playoff with the Letha Staf­
ford and Bernard Campbell 
teams. The three teams had 
scores of 64.

Playing with Mr. Smith 
were Joe H eyser, Joey 
Worley, Pat Owens and 
Gamer Altom. The Perry 
team  Included V andell 
W eathers, F red  Wende, 
Roger Aidrey and Sutton 
Crofts. Playing with Mr. 
Nichols were Flo Robinson, 
Manning Davis and Lucy 
ColUer.
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R&R Carpet
Maranatha Revival

Cleaninq
Rondoll Rogers, Owner

FOR FREE ESTIMATE’
Coll 629-1121

TC W r'

Over 8 years
service in this 

areo.

( r o re c lo sa re )
a ttC T IO N  

nmeav n o v u in  i • ii

SAU N«0 AT lASTlAND ONMn COUtTMOUSI STVS. 
fASTlAND, UXAS

Tw u  rauA nu co., domi n i  co., m c ,
CBCO.nXAS

MAI UTAH A MUIMIMIT A GOOtC MISWBS..

Located 1 nule East o f  C isco c i t y  
l im i t e  on a / S  o f  C. 3, Hwy 80.

FEATURES

30 ♦ Acres land
Approx. 32,000 sq. f t .  bu ild in ' js
Clay t i l e  p lant r e la ted  oqaipnont
batch mixer 1 hopper, iiammcrmill
Auger System, 2 -J . C. S tee le  type 20 s 30
extruders , cu tte r  system w ith  d ie s ,  conveyor
a i r  compressor, pa^ll^ts, welder,  fo rk l i^ ft ,
o f f i c e  fu rn itu re  and other  items. *

Presen t ly  leased to Texas A rch i te c tu ra l  C lay, Inc.

TERMS: CASH. CASHIERS CHECKS OR OTHER CHECKS 
ACCEPTED WITH LETTER OF GUARANTEE FROM 
yOUR BANK.
SUBSTITUTE TRUSTEE'S DEED TO BE FURNISHED.

INSPECTION! Represen tative  w i l l  be on property 
------------------ .Mond.iy, Oct. 31st 10AM to 5 PMm u i i u a y  ,  w .  * w «-»*-* v w  v

For further in form ation i  brochure, contact

COL lAUN SKAB A ASMCU1B 
I9M NTAL lAM N*. 1U 
OAUAS. TOAS 7SSM 
(214) MM2S2
NnMl N*. TXS4I440U M*, 9^

tIisfWfliimse
Generra 

Women's W ear
Cotuol Everyday Clothes at a 

Price You Can Afford.

Pants »23»® - »28®» 
Shirts »17®» -»34»»

V JW
The W earhouse  ̂ -

300 North Seaman * Eastland 629*8141^

will winterize your car

You  Can  

Depend On  

Electronic Ignition Systems

Tune-Ups

4Cyl. 6-Cyl. aCyl.

•34. ’38. *42.
Chadi charging, »tailing and angina »ystom» 

Install now »park plug» Sot timing Ad|u»t carburotor. 
whora appUcoWa. (Extra chorga If romovol 1» naca»»OfY).

Tram m  union 
Maintenance

» 2 8
Ropioca Huld, pan gotkot 
and III on xahtlo» ao 

oqulppod
Warrantod 90 day* or 4,000 
mllm, whlehovor coma» tint.

L ig h t s  F r o m  T h e  
C h r i s t i a n  W o r ld

To Start Oct. 24 Jo e eah in c C leve lan d

A chorus often heard 
around the MARANATHA 
BAPTIST CHURCH in part 
is “ The blessing’s will come 
down as the prayers go up” , 
the members have been 
praying for growth and the 
Lord has blessed. If you have 
passed down US 80 between 
Eastland and Cisco, no doubt 
you have seen this growth in 
progress.

The structure, housing 
baptistry, class rooms and 
fellowship hall, is material 
proof of the spiritual classes 
and prayer services. This 
two year old church con­
ducts three regular family 
services weekly. Teachers 
are as busy as are the Satur­
day hammers and saws. In­
dividual classes based on the 
King James Version Bible 
are taught at 10:00 a.m. Sun­
days. Also Sundays at 6:00

p.m. there are p rayer 
classes for the men and 
women. Youth Bible Quiz, 
preschool classes, and a 
‘chorus time’ class. There 
are also classes for the men­
tally handicapped both ser­
vices.

If you have not already 
been invited to the coming 
R ev iva l by one of the 
members of MARANATHA 
BAPTIST CHURCH con­
sider this your personal in­
vitation. Nightl;’ , 7:?0 p.m.... 
October 24-29, our pastor will 
be sharing God’s Word Vith 
us. If you do not like to drive 
at night or a distance, just 
ride our bus. That's what it is 
for! Call 629-8091 or 629-8344. 
We are country, down-to- 
earth folk who invite you to 
come worship and praise the 
Ixrd  as we learn together.

In 1831 two busy boroughs 
in New York City were 
separated by the East River. 
There were no telephones, 
radios or methods of com­
munication between these 
places. Only a small ferry 
gave a point of contact bet­
ween these boroughs.

An engineer, John Roebl- 
ing who started the first wire 
factory in the United States 
became interested in design­
ing bridges. He designed a 
plan whereby a suspension 
bridge over the East River 
would connect the two 
boroughs. While directing 
the construction he was 
fatally injured. His son com­
pleted the bridge, which is 
1,595 feel long and was the 
largest suspension bridge in 
the world when completed in 
1983.

The Professionals at 
Williamson Automotive!

RDR0NLY15®'
(Includes U p  to 2 gallons Anti-Freeze)j

For Radiator 
Protection

Front Wheel 
AUpiment 
including 

4-Wheel Drives

FARM BUREAUl 
SAFE MARK

Tires
You Can Depend On The

Gold Star Winners- (L  TO R ) Mrs. Dorothy Underwood of the Extension 
Homemakers presents $100 savings bonds to Shannon Caraway and Sue 
Ann Osborne for the the highest 4-H award at the county level.

2 Receive Highest County 4-H Award
The Gold Star Award is the 

highest 4-H award given at 
the county level. The award 
is not only an honor, but a 
privilege to receive. Only a 
few select Individuals per

S a l a  C l o s a  O u t  

P h o to  S u p p ly  B u sin *» »

county can receive the 
award per year. A Gold Star 
rec ip ien t spends many 
devoted hours and years of 
work to achieve this honor.

The Gold Star recipients 
for Eastland County are Sun 
Ann Osborne and Shannon 
Caraway. These two in­
dividuals will attend the

E a llr c  Stock Dlocountrd Below 
Deaten CoiL Come Elarly For Bett 
Selection. Shop Now For Chrtitmai.

Steal Deal»

■THE F  STOP 
IK  N. Lamar 
EaitUnd. Texas 7»M8 
(2S4332
October 17 till Stork Liquidation

COMPLETE AUTO 
SERVICE

...qualified mechanic on 
duty
...Transmission repair 
...air conditioner ser­
vice
... Lubrication-pollsh-O 
ulf tires
...Tire Distributor 
RO AD  S E R V IC E  
PICKUP & DELIVERY 
Int. 20 at Carbon Hwy. 

629-8894
R U B E N ’ S IN ­
TERSTATE GULF TC

A u c t io n 's  B e s t

by Fred Tucker

*1061 Auction Markotlng Naiwork

RETIRING OR MOVING?
At least 18 per cent of the people in Am erica 

will m ove this year. And m any of you a re think­
ing about retiring. These decisions a re  apart o f 
your life  and w ill a ffec t at least one out of eve ry
five o f your fam ily  and friends soon.

When making your re tir ing and m oving deci-
allsions you ’ ll soon d iscover that you’ve  really a c ­

cumulated a lot o f possessions in the last few  
years. And you’ ll quickly see that it wi l l  be ve ry  
difficu lt, time consuming and quite expensive 
to haul your possessions across the country or 
even around town.

But, you can turn these accum ulated posses­
sions into quick cash by holding an auction. A  
well planned auction can cash out your entire 
household in just a few  short hours. .And, I pro­
vide com plete auction serv ice  so you don’ t 
have to worry about a single detail

It ’ s a whole lot easier to have an auction and 
put cash in your wallet than it is to put your 
piano, re fr igera tor & hide a bed in a truck. And 
rem em ber, when it comes to buying or selling 
A U C T I O N ’S B E S T ,.m >

TUCKER AUCTION COMPANY
ROUTE 1. BOX 90 

EASTLAND, TEXAS 76446

Phon»629 '956
LiCGo#* number TXS-063

The magnificent Brooklyn 
Bridge hangs from steel 

cables which are nearly six­
teen inches thick. The cables 
are fastened to 275 foot 
towers at either end of the 
bridge. The bridges six lanes 
provides adequate room for 
motorists driving between 
Brooklyn and Manhattan.

Friend, God designed an 
even grater structure which 
would span the heavens. His 
Son willingly carried out and 
completed the design begun 
by His Father. CHRIST 
JESUS B E C A M E  TH E  
BRIIXiE. Using the vehicle 
of Faith you can depend on 
the strength and power of 
this Bridge to take you safely 
to this Eternal City planned 
and prepared for you.

The Dog House
Poodla Grooming & Other Small Breeds 

Hi way 80 West 
behind Harp's Cabinet Shop

817-629-1403 tf
'Penny Coplen Susan Alexander

drape((IEs
DRAPERIES

CLASSIFIED ADS 
GET RESULTS

DRAPERIES
BEIL DRAPERIES

Sunday, Oct. 16,1983
Ì/ 0 6 W  Com m erce tosi land. Texos 6 2 9 -I? )y

ASSER T

WEIGHT
CONTROL SYSTEMS / HABITS VS. DIETS

YOU CAN LOSE WEIGHT WITH ETHICAL HYPNOSIS
The A SSERT Weight Control System is a successful program with Ethical 

Hypnosis that can direct you towards your weight goal immediately No diets 
or special foods, no scare tactics, no «►wick treatment, no pills, no pam
THIS WEEK ONLY — FREE INTRODUCTORY MEETING.

Thurs., Oct. 20 - 7:30 p.m. White Elephant Inn

For information, call LIFE CLINIC (701) 237-9492

District 8 Gold Star Banquet 
November 1, 1983 in Waco.

Shannon and Sue Ann 
received an extra honor this 
year by bing selected the 
Gold Star recipients. They 
both were given a $100 dollar 
sa v in g  bond from  the 
Eastland County Extension 
Homemakers.

SMOKERS
You can 

quit 
smoking.
BECOME A NON-SMOKER WITH HYPNOSIS

The Assert Quit Smoking Plan is a successtui program with ethical hypnosis that can 
get you oil cigarettes, cigars, or pipes permanently 

No gaming weight no climbing the walls, no scare tactics no shock treatment no 
withdrawal, no pills, no pain SOUNDS IMPOSSIBLE7 Attend a FR EE introductory meeting 
and learn how you can become an ASSERT NON-SMOKER GRADUATE in 2 weeks 

Bring all the cigarettes you want Because after the Assert Program, you won't want 
them anymore

THIS WEEK ONLV! FREE introductory meeting at 7:30 p.m.

0 ASSBrrjouiT sm o king  p l a n  Jj)

Thurs., Oct. 20 - 7:30 p.m. Best Western White Elephant Inn
-Cisco

PROGRAMS AVAILABLE FOR GROUPS OR COMPANIES 
FOR INFORMATION CALL LIFE CLINIC. Fargo. N O (701) 237-9492

G Copyngbt by LIFE CLINIC Inc 1963 AM rights reserved

L e a m  t o
Y e a r  A h e a d

S u i^ iv a l in th e  '8 0 ’s is 
o n  e v e r y o n e  s nntna 
to d a y . D a le  C a rn e g ie  

T ra in in g ’"  c a n  h e lp  
YOU b e  b e t te r  p re p a re d  
fo r  m a k in g  im p o r ta n t 
d e c is io n s  a n d  te a c h  y o u  

th e  sk ills  th a t w ill k e e p  
y o u  in c o n tr o l o f  b u s in ess  
a n d  so c ia l s itu a tion s .
With the Dale Carnegie

p r o g ra m  y o u  w ill lea rn  
how to s p e a k  e f fe c t iv e ly  m  
p u b lic , m a k e  b e tte r  

d e c is io n s , d e v e lo p  y  . 
self- c o n f id e n c e  a n d  m u c h  
m o re . R e a liz e  y o u r  
c o m p le t e  b u s in ess  a n d
social potential by Dale
C a r n e g ie  T r a in in g -  L e  
us m a k e  a survivor out 
of you. Call today.

Pr.»»nt»<l by Harold A. Runuek 
\ssociates 
817-629-8585

& Associates
»  For mof» in lorm »lion c»H

U-Save Pharmacy
Enjoy Our

Drive-In Window Service 
Convenient Coll Ahead 
Good Parking

Connie's
.u«unc*e m topT o-'oe leather quoiiIv Side-2'DDea and  « ssea 

with sfifehea o e 'aii 'his b o o ' gives vou a  m os' a p p ea lin g  feeung 

m H«.« O' L«*»r also (lark »M* $ 7 4 9 *

Professionals at
W ILLIAM SON

A U T O M O T IV E ed
E. Main St. Eastland 629-2012

Open 8-6 Weekdoyt 
8-1 Soturdoy

201 S. Daugherty
629-1166

I : SPAoe Sfìk€ì̂ î ie-
j [ 20 629-2472

25% Off 
Fall & Winter
Slerchandise

Shop Now
Lay-A-Way Plan 

Available
Shop *5" to MS'» Sal» Rack

©avid & Quetta’»
Iijterstate 20 829-8030
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GAOOMINO • BATHING

DOGS-ftLL BR€€DS 
Specializing in Poodlw

Goldcp ®c8tipy
West Highway 80 
Open AAoa - Fri. 9 - 5 

629-8492 629-8194
Operated By: 
Lorraine Lester TC

■ ,  ■ "1  ■ ' ■ a.m. to 8:00 p.m. Friday and 10:00 a.m. to 3:30 p.m. Satur- Wright. Manager of the Chamber of C o i^ e rc e , states the
S u n d ay , Oct. If, 1183 p i»¡̂ íh«m» thousands of books, there will be baked goods the Chamber is working with two industries at present, and

H fm __ e  -  e » — (or sale. Proceeds will be used to buy equipment or add ser- expects one if not both to re léa te  in ^ s t l^ d ^  One wouldN  e  W S  l S F l 8 f  S  vices at the hospitol. employ about 150 people and the other 50 to 75. A new retail
...........................................................................................  business is also expected to locate here.

________________________________________________  The Cisco Chamber of Commerce is sponsoring a Retail ....................................................' ¿ ' . ' ' ' " . ’ " " ' " i " , .........
Trade Day Sale in downtown Cisco Sat., Oct. 15. Local mer- The Dale Carnegie Course, which is designed to help people 

CISCO chants will offer super bargains. A Rummage Sale is also meet the challenges of life in a positive way, will be o fto r^  in

Saturday, Oct. 29 will be annual Homecoming Day for Ex- planned for the day by the Cisco Kiwanis Club at the parking Eastland County this faU^ í
Students and wUl also be Parents Day on the Cisco Junior lot of Cisco Lumber and Supply. Falls, m anner and instructor ^
CoUege campus. Parents Day 1983 s t o i L  the many families ................................................................................................ the area m ^
who are represented at CJC. Activities will begin with The last Carp Tournament of the year wUl be held Sat.^Oct. calling 629-8585 for a personal interview.

registration from 10:00 tiU 10:30 a.m. in Manor Memorial 22 through Sun. Oct. 23 at Lake Cisco. Sponsors are Cisco ................................ . ■ ■ ‘ Ü
Library. There will be a Wrangler Belle reception honoring Pump and En Re Corporaüon. Entries can be obtained from The Comith B a p ^  Church, located
Pat Owens. Open House at the dormitories, a barbeque lun- these businesses, and everyone is invited to enter. Eastland and Cisco, has schooled
cheon, an a ft^ o o n  footbaU game, and other evento. ................................................................................................  P layer meetings will begin at 8:30.

ElASTLAND beginning at 7:00 p.m. Sunday evening preaching service will

The annual Book Fair of the E.L. Graham Memorial Steady growth is projected for Eastland and its schools, ac- begin at 8:30 p.m. J.B. Harlan of Pomt, Texas, "h o  p a s t^  a
Hospitol Auxiliary will be held Friday and Saturday, Oct. cording to the Eastland Chamber of Commrece, Bank, elec- church near Lake Tawakoni, will be the evangelist. Burdltt
14-15, in the lobby of the Laguna Hotel. Hours will be 10;00 trie service companies and local business people. Jam€S_ Hitt, the church’s pastor, invites t^ p u M c  t ^ t end the ser-
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Sale continues Thru Wednesday in

Eastland
u.S. Hwy. 80 East

Open 9 A.M. to 9 P.M./Monday-Saturday
WAL-MART S AOVERTISÍO MfRCMAMOlSe fOUCT-« AOuf »>tGOt»n to hav* 
avGrv advartiaad «  atoch Howwvwr * Ai* to ar>y un»o»GSGGn raaâ  a* 
advariraGd dGm «  not av*àeb» tor pore has* Wai MgtI wA laau« a 
on fGQuail »or to* m#«cnarto*a* to b* purchaaGd al tha sato prre* whGOĜr 
avaaabto or «a you a stmdar ilGm a» a cofnparadto r#<A*chon n prca Wa 
raaarva tha right to kmt(, quantwias

Save 1 7 3  
Dickies Mens Long 
Sleeve Work Shirt
•65% Polyesler/35% cotton 
•2 Button tront chest 

pockets »7 Button front
• Assorted colors
• 14'/2-17V? Neck sizes 
•Reg 9 73

•w Prices 
Every Day!

Save 1 93 
Dickies Mens 
Work Pants
•65% Polyester/

35% cotton
•2 Button back pockets 
•Belt loops •Assorted 
colors •29-44 
Waist size 

•Various lengths 
•Reg 10 93

save Even More During 
Our Grand Opening!!

■

f f u L i:

i ’ f 7^

'/m m

Vt/u j Z D

2.97^^! 11.8 43 P r . 
P a c k

Save 21%
Mens 3 Pair Grey 
Tube Sock
•75% Acrylic 25% nylon 
•Gfey witn assorted color 
sif'pe lops »Sijes 10-13 
•Reg 3 76

Save 1 5%
Ironing Board 
Pad and Cover
•Pastel colors •Color 
matched cover and foam 
pad *No 8696 •Reg 2 17

Save 2 .5 8  
4 Gun Wall Rack
•Solid pine with hardwood 

finish •Includes 
necessary hardware for 
easy assembly 

•No 791002 •Reg 7 86

Save 25%  
Nationwide 
Super Octane
• 12 Ounces «Slops knocK 
ping and poor perlormance 
caused by todays low 
octane (uel «No S 290 

•Reg 1 24

5 .2 8

T f

2 .9 7
Save 25%
Good Nite Light

3  P a i r  
P k g .

Ladies 3 Pair Packaged Panties
• 100% Trilobal nylon and eiderlon «50/50 Polyester/ 
cotton «Briets with cotton crotch, no-show decorative 
elastic «White and pastel colors «Sizes 5 to 10

•On at dusk, oft at 
dawn, automatically 

•Perfect for child s 
room, bathroom or 
hallway «Provides 
security and safety 

•No GNL-7 «Reg 3 96

DIKII "I 
I0HMUI« 1K« SUMI 

lOkMUlt 1'm> siâw 
MHIMUU

ft J-

C o m e t
C l e a n s e r
•1 4 Ounce size

C v w y  D v y  l o w  P f k ê

Colleen Bedroom Ensemble
•Polyester lace «Beige color •Rrisciiia-’ 08>8-i 

inches with 7 inch rutile «Bedspread-iace lace 
nylon tricot back 4 ounce bonded polyester i'" 
2-7 inch rutiles «Sham-21 »26 inches witn 7 neh 
rutile

3 4 .8 3 Twin
Sprood
Reg 43 52

£ tJ k  fu ll SprMd 
• » • ♦ ■ W ^ T R e g  52 52

Ouoon Sprood
Reg 59 52

1 0 k 8 2
Shorn
Reg 13 52

2 9 . 7 4

Save 17% 
Unbleached Muslin
• '0 0  ' Colton »Greal lo» 
quilling «aS-SS Incbes wde 

•Reg 1 07 yard

Pri telila* 
Reg 34 52 8 8 « Yard

¡«rAffi

Save Up To 2 00 
Abby Rose Printed 

I Cape Cod Curtains
•50/50 Polyester blend 
■Natural rose yellow 
all over print *\H

■ Tlw
I Mi3t liwhat

Rag e r e

Tiar
I e O « 4 S  I n c h . «  
iRag 8 87

FVtianca ,
i M t l O W  I n c h . «  
iRag 5 2e

»
Save 1 7®o
Antique Album Prints
eioo^ Co»ton *44-45 inches 

w oe «Coora nai'og cotton 
D' nts fO' Qu t ng anfl nonr>0 
aeco'atng #Reg 2 97 ya»02M Yard

POR
Save 23%
Embroidered Fingertip Towels
•86% Cotton 14% polyester (exclusive of 

decoration) «Fingertip guest towels with 
embroidered embellishments «Several colors to 
choose from «Reg 1 96

P a c k
BIc Ledy Shever 
3 Pack
•Limit 2

1 . 2 1
No Bake Real Ct
• ’ I (Jiim ■ •Delicio
•I mill

$4 Box
■ ot 10

Save }  1 “o 
Glad lo Gallon 
Trash Can Linei
•III u(i lo so g.illoi 

Iri'l »(iieen (lolyel 
(i.K'kagi »No HP-i

[diu

3 .3 Ï
Save 1.01 
One Gallon 
Heavy Duty Ga
• 1 Liailon «Cìalvar 

and tuliy solderei

\

o 3 Peeke 
ÊÊÊÊ Por

Cracker Jack
3 Pack •Caramel p 
Limit 2 packs

Wal-Mart really does sell for less every day!!
♦ V 1-1 S»*ii . f- - r 1 »>ss M.*r f Sp*K for lp^  ̂ • W.it M «r f Sr* 11-, »nr 1 . • W .il Mr«r t S f i l . lof i •• • V.i» M « '»• n . »« f I f -  • W.*l M .ir t SpHs for I PA» • Wet Mat t SpH» io r • WaI M *ir i S«H% for Ins* • W.it M ,sf ! S*-Hs »nr 1 .s  • W,»i M .tri fn» 1rs- • '\.»t M .m< Snlfs I** as • A aI



vices.

RANGER

.. ® ® ^an
4,000. The Chamber of Commerce and Mike Ford, Chairman 
Roaring Ranger Days, thanks the hundreds of individuals 
who worked together in the preparation of the booths, special 
area, decorating the downtown, and the provision of food and 
drinks for everyone. It is planned to continue the Roaring 
Ranger Days as an annual celebration, adding interesting 
things each year.

Ranger Volunteer Firemen will host the North Central 
Texas District Fire Convention Saturday, Oct. 15. Big name 
firefighters. Boots and Coots will be featured. Represen­
tatives from fire departments in the district will be present 
for a fun filled day. A catered barbeque dinner will be served 
at the school cafeteria, advance tickets only, approx. 7:30 
p.m.

o t  L tit •  Stils for Lass •  Wal M an Stils for Lest

n o l M k i *

W  real 
/  cheese 

cake

1 . 2 7
No Bake Real Cheese Cake Mix
• ' I (Jiin. • )clicious cheese flavor
• 1 lililí ,

Save 
Glad 10 Gallon 
Trash Can Liners
•I il 1(1 U) ii I q.illon cahs 

li'i l «(ireen polyethylene 
p.ii’Kag« »No HP-643-A

•2 Feel b inches x 3 
• 10 Count (dispenser 
«Reg 1 27

RISING STAR
Recipients of the Eastland County 4-H Gold Star awards 

are Shannon Caraway and Sue Ann Osborne, both of Gorman. 
Also nemed for honors at the 4-H Awards Bannquet held in 
Rising Star were Becky Jo Underwood of Gorman and Shan­
non Kendall of Nimrod, recieving the Danforth Award. Bo 
Caraway of Gorman was named outstanding adult 4-H 
leader. Congressman Charles W. Stenholm spoke to a large 
crowd assembled at the banquet.

The Rising Star 4-H Club has collected over $455.00 in the 
Cystic Fibrosis campaign, with more than 20 members par­
ticipating. Rising Star merchants and business people 
assisted with contributing reaching the total in one day. All 
hope to help wipe out the No. 1 genetic killer of children and 
young adults.

Courthouse
Report

Chief of Police Herbert Hooten of Rising Star has begun an 
active reserve force in the town. Rudy Sayas is Captain, Guy 
Stewart is lieutenant, and Delbert Biggs is sergeant. They 
have recieved certification for this volunteer work. Chief of 
Police Hooten is on duty during days, and Robert Fletcher, a 
graduate of the Police Training School in Abilene, is night 
patrolman.

John Delano Pointer 49 of 
Cross Plains has his proba­
tion revoked this week in 91st 
Dist. Court by Jim R. 
W righ t. Judge W righ t 
ordered Pointer to serve 10 
days in the Eastland Co. jail 
and fined him $150.00 Pointer 
had been arrested west of 
Ranger on Int. 20 June 27, 
1981 by DPS Trooper Leroy 
Polnick. He was placed on 
probation July 10, 1981. He 
failed to report to the proba­
tion clerk as ordered. 
* # ★ * ★ ★ * * ★ ★ * * * * •  

Gary Lynn Washington 22 
of Houston • formerly a

GEORGE AND LENNY 
The opening production of the 1983-84 theatre 

season at the Roof Garden Dinner Theatre will 
be John Steinbeck’s classic drama OF MICE 
AND MEN sponsored by the Fine Arts Depart­
ment of Cisco Junior college. OF MICE AND 
MEN is a tremendously moving story about two 
roving farmhands during the 1930’s, one of whom 
-  “ with the strength of a gorilla and the mind of 
an untutored child’ ’ -  unwittingly murders a 
woman. Ultimately it is a story about brotherly 
love in a cruel and indefferent world. * * *• 

There will be three preview performaficèâ ̂  
(show only) Monday, Tuesday and Wednesday 
nights October 17-19 beginning at 7:30 p.m. 
primarily for the student audiences with CJC  
student tickets at $1.00 and all other tickets $4.00. 
Dinner Theatre performances will be held 
Thursday and Friday nights October 20 and 21 
with dinner seved at 7 p.m Tickets are $8.00 
regular admission, $7.00 CJC student admission.

Shown are John Akes and Michael Riser

PR O  R A L L Y  IN  
EASTLAND CANCELLED
John Grimahaw, chairman 

of the Texas Pro Rally, said 
the sports car competition 
planned for Saturday in nor­
thern Erath County and the 
eastern edge of Eastland 
County has been cancelled.

The Stephenville Chamber 
of Conunerce and the Erath 
County judge had endorsed 
the races, he said, but later 
changed I M »  minds.

He $8|L^^j| lso met a 
roadblbcAiriSatnand Coun­
ty when Eastland County 
C om m issioner Jack 
Blackwell vetoed the race, 
which was to be held as part 
of a national rally.

Blackwell cited the objec- 
Uon of Roy Johnson, a lan­
downer who lives about two 
miles from the proposed 
race route, Grimshaw said.

J  & D Carpets
Sales & Installation 

Located in Pogue Industrial Park

¡We Have A Sale Everyday
We Have Carpet, Vinyl & Tile

I f r M  M im â tes All Work Guaranteed:^■sf

"Sell It"
^  SO - We Are.

Beginning Sot., Oct. 15th.
Mony Item s Are Reduced

Gerry Ski Woor.......................... 50%  OH
Walls Jackets............................. 20%  o h

Walls Coveralls...........................15 %  o h

W indbreakers.................................. o h

Sofia Jackets............................ 20% o h

One Group Nike Shoes............... 30%  o h

One Rack W rtS...........................50%  OH
CooM in Now for Boot Seloetlon 

mo's sports
XmOm t, Tk. 7444S SOS i .  SWe S1S4MI

Ranger Junior College stu­
dent pled guilty to two counts 
of criminal trepass this week 
in 91st District Court before 
Judge Jim R. Wright. He 
was ordered to serve 15 days 
in the County jail on each 
count.

Washington had been 
charged with entering the 
girls dormitory at Ranger 
Junior College October 1, 
1983. He was arrested Oc­
tober 4, by the Eastland 
County Sheriffs Department.

Washington waived his 
right to an attorney. Emory 
Walton was the prosecuting

BOWLING
Standing for the Tuesday 

Nite Owls are as follows: 
1.Whose I t ’ s; 2.Modern 
Barber Shop; 3.Golden 
D estin y ; 4 .KVM X-Good 
Vibrations; 5.Greenwood 
Auto P a rts -R a n ge r;
6. Janie's Beauty Salon;
7. Austin O il; 8.R o llin g  
Stones.

High game (scratch) was; 
l.Jayne Jones 212; 2.Pearl 
Campbell 202; 3.Marily Van- 
Zandt 194.

High series (scratch) was:
1. P e a r l Cam pbell 508;
2. Nelda Nevill 489 ; 3.Shirley 
Abies 483.

Sunday, Oct. 16, 1983

attorney.
r W W A rW W W W W W W W W ’WW

Two San Antonio men 
entered guilty pleas Thurs­
day afternoon in 91st District 
Court.

Charles Duane Grant and 
Thomas Clint Tondre Jr., 
both 39, were each charged 
with unlawfully carrying 
weapons (firea rm s) and 
possession of a controlled 
substance, barbituric-acid 
derivative.

Judge Jim R. Wright fined 
both men $1,000 on each 
count, bringing each man’s 
fines to $2,000. Wright also 
handed down probated one- 
year sentences in Eastland 
(bounty jail to Grant and Ton­
dre.

The men were arrested 
Dec. 10, 1982, at Uie Best 
Western Motel in Eastland 
by Police Chief Bobby Ar­
riola and Sheriff Johnnie 
Morren.

Attorney Bob Chappell of 
Abilene represented Grant 
and Tondre. Emory Walton, 
d is tr ic t  a tto rn ey , p ro­
secuted.
•t r ir k 'k i iir t iir k ir t iV r k ir i

Qifford Dalton Jennings, 
18, of San Angelo, formerly 
of (Tisco, pleaded guilty to a 
Cisco residential burglary 
Thursday afternoon in 91st 
District Court.

Jennings was sentenced to 
five years in the Texas 
Department of Corrections, 
with the sentence probated 
for five years by Judge Jim 
R. Wright. Jennings also was 
ordered to make restition of 
$100, the amount reportedly 
taken in the burglary.

A theft was reported Nov. 
28, 1962, at the home of Carl 
Bagley in Cisco. Jennings 
was arrested one month 
later by Jackie Hobbs, Cisco 
police detective.

T im  Edwards of San 
Angelo represented Jenn­
ings, and District Attorney 
Elmory Walton prosecuted.

Two men were convicted 
on charges of driving while 
intoxicated in two separate

jury trials conducted this 
week In 01st District Court

In a two-day trial that sail­
ed Thursday, an Fastland 
County Jury found a Riaiag 
Star man guilty of felony 
DWl.

Wayne Buford Dalton, 06. 
was assessed three years in 
the Texas Department of 
Corrections and was fined 
$100 for the charge.

Dalton was arrested June 
28 in Rising Star by Con­
stable Gene Hicks. Hicks 
testified  that while in­
vestigating a report about an 
alleged disturbance, he saw 
a pickup truck being driven 
erratically. Hicks said he 
stopped the driver of the 
truck, and he identified 
Dalton as the driver.

Departm ent of Public 
Safety Trooper Robert Ralls, 
who adm in is tered  a 
b rea th a lizer tes t, said 
Dalton’s blood-alcohol level 
measured .20. The legal level 
for intoxication is .10.

Dalton, testifying in his 
own defense, told the Jury he 
was not driving the pickup 
truck but that he was at 
home on his front pordi at 
the t im e  the in c iden t 
rep o rted ly  occu red . 
However Dalton did not deny 
being intoxicated that even­
ing.

Truman Kirk of Cisco 
represented Dalton. Elmory 
Walton, Eastland County 
district attorney, was the 
prosecuting attorney.

In another Jury trial con­
ducted Tuesday, a 33-yeor- 
old Dallas man was con­
victed on a first-offense DWI 
charge.

The Jury assessed Charles 
Daniel Bull’s punishment at 
one year in the county Jail 
and fined him $150. Because 
Bull had no prior convic­
tions, he was given two years 
probation for the sentence.

Bull was arrested Nov. 22, 
1962, south of here on 1-20 by 
DPS Trooper Robert Ralls.

Ben Suddereth of Coman­
che represented Bull. Emory 
Walton prosecuted.

Grand Opening For
The Hewer Shop

207 E. Sth Cbco 442-4531

Saturday, Octobor 15,1983  

9:00 - 6:00

Door Prizes

Drawing Will Be 
At 4:00 p.m.

For A Plant Garden

Forrest A. Eisenrich, M,D.
Eddie T. Moore, M.D,

and
Vincenzo Giustino, MJ). 
are Pleased to Announce 

the Association o f
TonyR. Russso, MJ),

in their Medical Practice 
located at 405 S, Texas St, 

De Leon, Texas 76444 
817-893-2051

Office Hours by Appointment
T-$9
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Drilling Bits
At a location two miles 

Northwest of Rising £lar, 
Bergen Enterprises of San 
Saba has finaled a new oil 
producer in Eastland Coun­
ty’s Eastland Regular Field.

The well is designated as 
the No. 1-A F. W. Roberds, 
flowing oil at the rate of 35 
barrels per day.

liocation is in a 80-acre 
lease in the Sec. 26 blk. 2,
E .T RR Co. Sur\ ey The well 
will produce from perfora­
tions 1,162 to 1,090 into the 
hole.

H.G. Sledge of Midland 
has filed first prduction 
figures on a new oil well in 
the REB Field. The No. 4 Jan 
San 21 showed potential ‘ o 
make 67 barrels of oil per 
day.

The operator has 170 acres 
leased, with drillsite in 
Eastland County’s Sec. 21, 
blk 4, H&TC RR Co. Survey, 
SIX miles Southeast from 
Flastland.

The well will produce from 
an interval 3,532 to 3,554 feet 
into the wellbore. Total drill­
ing depth was 3,980 feet.

The No. 12-1 Martin Unit 
#12 has been finaled by Mor­
rison Energy Co. of Abilene.

It is a developmental well 
in the Moreno Field, five 
m iles South of Carbon. 
Drillsite is in a 40-acre lease 
in Eastland County’s C.L. 
I/Otham Survey 

Daily potential of seven 
barrels was posted with the 
Railroad Conumssion. The 
well went to a 3,000-ft. bot­
tom, and top of pay zone was 
logged at 2.648 feet. Produc­
tion will be from perfora­
tions 2,664 to 2,702 feet into 
the wellbore.

At a location one mile Nor­
thwest of Romney, Buck 
Wheat Resources Inc. of 
Eastland has finaled a new 
oil producer in Eastland 
County’s Hawk-Eye Field

The well is designated as 
the No. 1 M G. Gibson, flow­
ing oil at the rate of eight 
harries per day.

I/Kation is in a 81-acre 
lease in the Sec. 58, blk. 3, 
H iTC  RR Co A-1947 Survey 
Bottomed at 1.260 feet, the 
well will produce from per­
forations 1,083 to 1,086 into 
the hole.

T o p o g r a p h i c

MAPS

TELEGRAM

Morrison Energy Co. of 
Abilene has filed first pro­
duction figures on a new oil 
well in the Morenco Field. 
The No. 4 Martin Unit *4 
showed potential to make six 
barrels of oil per day 

The operator has 40 acres 
leased, with drillsite in 
Eastiand County’s Nugent 
A-164 Survey, four miles 
South of Carbon.

The well will produce from 
an interval 2,650 to 2,694 feet 
into the wellbore. Total drill­
ing depth was 3,000 feet.

The No. 2 M.K. Courtney 
“ C”  has been completed by 
Southeastern Resources 
Corp.

It is a developmental well 
in the JMJ Field five miles 
Northw est of Eastland 
Counry’s H&TC RR Co. #32 
Survey.

Daily potential of 35 bar­
rels was posted with the 
Railroad Commission. The 
well went to a 3,572-ft. bot­
tom, and top of pay zone was 
logged at 3,342 feet Produc­
tion will be from perfora­
tions 3,392 to 3,398 feet into 
the wellbore

Producing 132 barrels of 
oil per day, along with 
192,000 CF casinghead gas, 
the No. 46 U ke Leon was 
completed succesfully by 
The Dallas Group Inc. of 
Mesquite.

Drillsite is eight miles 
Southeast of Eastland.

It was drilled to 3,740 ft. 
total depth and will produce 
from an interval 3,273 to 
3,296 feet into the weUbore. 
Production tests were run on 
a 32/64 choke, and tubing 
pressure registered 114 PSI.

The location is in a 20-acre 
lease in Eastland County’s 
liOt 22, W.M. Van Norman 
A-545 Survey.

At a location five miles 
North of Eastland, C.R. 
Gallagher of Lubbock has 
finaled a new oil producer in 
Eastland County’ s REB 
Field.

The well is designated as 
the No. 1 Johnson, flowmg oil 
at the rate of 85 barrels per 
day Tubing pressure was 50 
PSI The well also showed 
potential for 150,000 cubic 
feet of casinghead gas per 
day

Ixication is in a 42-acre 
lease in' the Sec. 35, Blk 4, 
H&TC RR Co. Survey Bot­
tomed at 3,865 feet, the well 
will produce from perfora­
tions 3,505 to 3,527 into the 
hole

Stephenson Oil & Gas Inc. 
of Eastland has filed frist 
production figures on a new 
oil well in the Eastland 
Regular Field. The No. 1 
Gladys Hartmand showed 
potential to make nine bar­
rels of oil per day. The 
operator has 40-acres leased 
with drillsite in Eastland 
County’s Sec. 16, blk. 2, 
HitTC RR Co. Survey, three 
miles Northeast of Carbon.

The well will produce from 
an interval 1,115 to 1,118 feet 
into the wellbore. Total drill­
ing depth was 1,350 feet.

The No. 1 Hill has been 
fin a led  by Cordova 
Resources Inc. of Dallas.

It is a developemental well 
in the Eastland Regular 
Field, one mile West of 
Pioneer. Drillsite is in a 
30-acre lease in the Eastland 
County’s T. Benson A-21 
Survey.

Daily potential of 13 bar­
rels was posted with the 
Railroad Commission. The 
weU went to a 2,570-ft. bot­
tom, and top of pay zone was 
logged at 2,480 feet. Produc­
tion will be from perfora­
tions 2,483 to 2,524 feet into 
the Wellbore.

Flagco Snyder has filed 
first production figures on a 
new oil well in the Eastalnd 
Regular field. The No. 5 
David G. Watson showed 
potential to make two bar­
rels of oil per day.

The operator has 91 acres 
leased, with drillsite in 
Eastland County’s Sec. 78 
Blk. 3, HliTC RR Co. A-1431 
S u rvey , th ree  m iles  
Southeast of Nimrod.

The well will produce from 
an interval 1,287 to 1,289 feet 
into the wellbore. Total drill­
ing depth was IJJS JSH y  ,

Lone Star Title 
& Abstract Co.

J o e  B .  K o o f \ c e ,  M g r .

101 W . Main
Eastland, Texas 76448 

(817) 629'2683

T H E  I

,

1 Open

S T A N D A R D  |
1 1 Cased

O F  1
] r  Hole

E X C E L L E N C E  |

i

II Service

1
1

1

g n u m A R O PERFORATORS
Asii.aMa.Tax A « rnoMa e73-34aa

well is planned by Katlaco 
Operating Inc. of Lubbock at 
a drillsite three miles Nor­
theast of Cisco, Eastland 
County. The location is in a 
40-acre lease in the Sec. 69, 
Fee,“ F ". It is in the Kleiner 
Field.

Supreme Oil Co. of Abilene 
has filed for permit to drill 
the No. 1 Charles Massagee, 
a 750-ft. developmental well 
10 m iles  Southeast of 
Ranger. Location is in a 
136-acre lease in Eastland 
Regular Field.

A F t. W orth -based 
operator has staked location 
for the No. 1 M.K. Courtney, 
a developmental well to be 
located four miles North of 
Eastland. With projected 
total depth of 4,500 feet, the 
well is in a 80-acre lease in in 
Eastland County’s Marble 
Falls Field, Sec. 40 Blk. 4, 
H&TC RR Co. Survey. The 
op era to r is Leonard  
Brothers Operatining Co.

is seven miles Northwest of 
Eastland.

A 4,500-ft. developmental 
well is planned by Leonard 
Brothers Operating Co. of 
Ft. Worth at a drillsite four 
miles North of Eastland, 
Eastland County. The loca­
tion is in a 160-acre lease in 
the Sec. 22, Blk. 4, H&TC RR 
Co. A-1994 Survey. Well’s 
designation is the No. 1 
Simer. It is in the Marble 
Falls Field.

Two 1,150-ft. re-entry tries 
are planned by Blanco In­
dustries Inc. of Blanco at a 
drillsite two miles North of 
Rising Star, Eastland Coun­
ty. The location is in an 
80-acre lease in the Sec. 26, 
Blk. 2, ET RR Co. A-853 
Survey. The w ells are 
designated as the No. 2 and 
No. 3 J.T. Alford, in the 
Waldrop Field.

A 4,000 ft. developmental

Snow 
Oil Plaza

Snow Oil Co. of Ft. Worth 
has revealed plans to drill a 
4,000-ft. developmental well 
in the Marble Falls Field. 
The operator has 168 acres 
leased, with drillsite in 
Eastland County’s Sec. 36, 
Blk. 4, H&TC RR Co. A-2021 

designated 
the venture as the No. 2 
Castleberry-West. Drillsite

A Grand Prarie-based 
operator has staked location 
for the No. 3 Ranger West 
Strawn Unit, a developmen­
tal well to be located six 
miles Northwest of Ranger. 
With projected toUl depth of 
2,000 feet, the well is in a 
169-acre lease  in the 
Eastland County’s T&NO 
RR Co. A-533, R.B. Truly 
A-625 and S.J. Robinson 
A-424 Surveys.

The operator is North 
Ridge Corp.

Richey St Co. inc. of Ft. 
Worth has revealed plans to 
drill a 4,200-ft. developmen­
tal well in the REB Field. 
The operator has 40-acres 
leased, with drillsite in 
Eastland County’s Sec. 38, 
Blk. 4, H&TC RR Co. A-1883 
Survey and has designated 
the venture as the No. 1 Kin­
caid A. Drillsite is eight 
miles Northeast of Cisco.

A 4,000-ft. developmental 
well is planned by Trinity 
Exploration Co. of Ft. Worth 
at a drillsite eight miles Nor­
thwest of R is ing Star, 
Eastland County. The loca­
tion is in a 240-acre lease in 
the J.W. Montgomery A-1167 
Survey. Well’s designation is 
the No.l Helen Crawford. It 
is in the T Jl.C. F iol(L  ..

has filed for permit to drill 
the No. 1 W.D. Brown, a 
3,000-ft developmental well 
five miles Northwest of Gor­
man. Location is in a 
160-acre lease In Eastland 
County’s Sec. 11, Blk. 1, 
HitTC RR Co. A-199 Survey. 
The well is in the Eastland 
Regular Field.

Flowing 1,398,000 CF gas 
per day on a half-inch choke, 
a new producer has been 
brought on line in Palo Pinto 
County’s Riebe Field 10 
miles north of Gordon.

It is the No. 2 H.W. Riebe, 
carrying an absolute open 
flow rating of 2,100,000 CFD. 
Location is in a 305-acre 
lease in the T&PRR Survey.

Edwin S. Nichols Explora­
tions Ltd. of Meridian is the 
operator. The well bottomed 
at 4,000 feert and will pro­
duce from a set of perfora­
tions in the Atoka con­
glomerate, 3,872 to 3,880 feet 
into the wellbore.

McMillan Operating is 
planning a wildcat pullback 
for gas pay nine miles 
southwest of the Town of 
Palo Pinto. The Abilene firm 
has 220 acres leased, with 
drills ite in the T& PR R  
Survey.

The well in question is the 
No. 2 Irsfeld. Propsoed total 
depth is 4,040 feet.

Chester R. Upham Jr. of 
Mineral Wells has filed for 
permit to drill the No. 2 
Chasta in , a 4,600 ft. 
developmental venture in 
P a lo  P in to  C ounty ’ s 
Calabria Field. The opera­
tion will be in a 393-acre 
lease block in the George 
Green Survey, about two 
m iles northeast o f the 

, Brazos community.

Northwest of Breckenridge, 
Ensearch Exploration Inc. 
has finaled a new oil pr^ 
ducer in Stephens County’s 
Sec. 12 Blk. 10, S.P. RR Co. 
Field.

The well is designated as 
the No. 3 J.W. Stourd Unit, 
flowing at the rate of 122 bar­
rels per day on 10/64 choke. 
Tubing pressure was 840,000 
PSI.

l.ocation is in a 41-acre 
lease in the Sec. 12, Blk. 10, 
S.P. RR Co. Survey. Bottom­
ed at 4,6660 feet, the well will 
produce from perforations 
4,294 to 4,309 into the hole.

Piranha Production Inc. of 
Graham has filed first pro­
duction figures on a new oil 
well in the Rickies Field. The 
No. 9 Ed Hinson showed

potential to make 14 barrels 
of oil and 200,000 CF cas­
inghead gas per day.

The operator has 320 acres 
leased, with drillsite in 
Stephens County’s Sec. 7 
Blk. 2, SP RR Co. Survey, 
five miles Southeast from 
Eliasville.

The well will produce from 
an interval 4,152 to 4,176 feet 
into the wellbore. Total drill­
ing depth was 4,320 feet.

Advertising Pays

80 Acre lease, good loca­
tion, south of Cisco, J2600. 
Call 806-763-5323 T90

VIC’S WELDING &
m u f f l e r  s h o p p e

M onday — Saturday - 8 to 5

106 S. Virginia
Eastland

Ni . 629-2874 rc

Factory Outlet
I s o d s p r e a d s  —  C o m f o r t o r s  —  S h e e t s  

M a t t r e s s  P a d s  —  T o w e l s  -  E t c .

Merchondise Arriving Doily
Spreods start ot $20.00

Twin, FuM, Queen and King Sizes

The Back Room
Adioining Beil Draperies

B&B Operating of Odessa At a location nine miles
629 1319

I c : } L n d ,
l e x o s

Pips & Supply

Drilling Corp.

Well Service

OH (817) 629 8521

Linda Nelson
(817) 629 8123

EASTLAND 
DRILLING 

INC
817/629-8512 

24 Hour Numbur

3 Rotary R:gs
MRng dtpSi from ISOS' to 6000'
AN Rigs Radio Equippod with 24 hr. 
answering servita phis phone patch.

(sory Snopp, Vita Prasidant A Oparotions 
Mgr.

Ras. Phont 817/647-3416 
23 Yrs. Olfiald Exporianca

Kirby
f t

VACUUM
CLEANER

* CITY No. 7

i

G .R .I. Buys Wasted "W et" Gos
If you are flaring, have and MCF pipline contract or shut-in, our gas liquid reclamation 

systems can recover lost liquids from gas strems that produce just 60 MCF/D. Let G.I.R. 
lease the procesing right to your gas streams.

Contact Bill Westberry 
Gas Reclamation, Inc.

3000 S. Post Oak, Suite 1640 Houston, Tx. 77056
(713)840-0852 Telexi 79-0759 TexWell Hou t-84

1200 W. Main 
Eastland, Texas

Kirby
Authorized Sales & Service

Parts - Service - Supplies 

on All Makes & Models
817-629-8732 T F

One Thing After Another -

. . . .  can and may happen to land titles in the passing of 
moments. During the time it takes you to read this ad, 
something could happen to your title that would change 
your whole financial structure, or indeed it could alter your 
plans and aspirations for generations to come. The 
abstracter, in a sense, is your land title guardian, for he 
keeps the records day by day as you or others make them. 
Advise with him often about your title.

Eastland County Abstract Company

112 W. Commerce, 
Eastland, Texas

R. PatMiUer Annelle B. Miller
TC

MOTOR HOTEL

Year Round^lnn-Door Summer Fun
2 Locations

Abilene & Wichita Falls 
975-695-2750 8 1 7-766-6000

w m y
Restaurant C

BRU N CH  7 7 AM-2 PM  SU N D AY  
LUNCH 11:30 AM-2 PM  W EEKD A YS  

DINNER 6 PM -11 PM  W EEKD A YS  
& Saturday

O PEN 6 AM-10 PM  
W EEK D A YS and SUNDAY. 

TILL  7 7 PM  SA TU R D A Y



legal notices
(Editor's Note; I)r. E.E. Addy of Cisco Mas 

honored recently as the first graduate of 
Southwestern Medical School when the

University of Texas Health Science Center 
observed the 40th anniversary of the school. 
The Center Times, official newspaper of the

school, sent a reporter to Cisco to interview 
Dr, Addy and the article prepared for the 
newspaper's 40th anniversary edition is

reprinted herewith. |

Reprinted From C E N T E F ^ M E S

I

Sealed proposals will be 
received by Cisco Indepen­
dent School District at the 
Superintendent’ s O ffice, 
P.O. Box 1645, Cisco, Texas, 
76437. Said bids will be open­
ed and considered thereafter 
at the School Tax Office, 610 
Hilton Avenue, Cisco, Texas, 
at 7:30 p.m., for the con­
struction of a concrete tennis 
court-play area located at 
the Intermediate School, 
Avenue H & 11th Street.

Plans and bid forms are 
available to bidders at the 
Office of the Supreintendent, 
Cisco ISD.

Cisco ISI) reserves the 
right to reject any or all bids 
and waive informalities or 
minor regulations in the 
bids.

October 23, p-«5

NOTICE OF ELEtTIO N 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

COUNTY OF EASTLAND
CITY OF CISCO 

TO TH E  R E S ID E N T , 
Q U A L IF IE D  ELECTORS 
OF .SAID CITY:

TAKE NOTICE that an 
election will be held in said 
City as provided in an OR­
DINANCE CALL AN ELEC­
TION duly passed by the Ci­
ty Council of said City, which 
Ordinance is substantially as 
follows;

ORDINANCE CALLING  
AN ELECTION 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
COUNTY OF EASTLAND 
CITY OF CISCO 
W H E R E AS , this C ity 

('ouncil of said City deems it 
advisable to call the election 
hereinafter ordered; and 

WHEREAS, it is hereby of­
ficially found and detennin- 
(*d that a case of emergency 
or urgent public necessity 
exists which requires the 
holding of the meeting at 
which this Ordinance is pass­
ed, such em ergency or 
urgent public necessity be­
ing that the proceeds from 
the sale of the proposed 
bonds are required as soon 
as possible and without 
delay for necessary and 
urgently needed public im­
provements; and that said 
meeting was open to the 
public, and public notice of 
the time, place and purpose 
of said meeting was given, 
all as required by Vernon’s 
Ann. Civ. St. Article 6252-17.

THEREFORE, BE IT OR­
DAINED BY THE CITY 
COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
CISCO:

1. That an election shall be 
held on November 19,1983, in 
said City, at the following 
designated polling place:

CORRAL ROOM. VICTOR 
HOTEL. 400 AVENUE D. 
CISCO TEXAS.
Said City shall constitute a 
single election precinct for 
said election, and the follow­
ing election officers are 
heieby appointed to hold 
said election:

Presiding Judge: M.L. 
Bailey

A lte rn a te  P res id in g  
Judge: Margaret Torres

2. That the Presiding 
Judge shall appoint not less 
than two qualified election 
clerks to serve and assist in 
conducting said election; 
p rov id ed  that if the 
Presiding Judge actually 
serves as expected, the 
Alternate Presiding Judge 
shall be one of such clerks.

3 That by approving and 
singing this Ordinance the 
Mayor of said City officially 
confirms his appointment of 
the aforesaid election of­
ficers to serve at said elec­
tion; and by passing this Or­
dinance the governing body 
of said City approves and 
cjicurs in the appointment 
of the aforesaid election of­
ficers.

4. That a ll resident, 
qualified electors of said city 
shall be entitled to vote at 
said election.

5. That notice of said elec­
tion shall be given by posting 
a substantial copy of this Or­
dinance at the City Hall and 
at three other places in said 
City, not less than 15 days 
prior to the date set for said 
election; and a substantial 
copy of this Ordinance also 
shall be published on the 
same day in each of two suc­
cess ive  w eeks in a 
newspaper of general cir­
culation published in said Ci­
ty, the date of the first 
publication to be not less 
than 14 days prior to the date 
set for said election.

6. That at said election the 
following PROPOSITIONS 
shall be submitted in accor­
dance with law:

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
Shall the City Council of 

said City be authoriied to 
issue the combination tax

and revenue certificates of 
obligation of said City, in one 
or more series or issues, in 
the aggregate  principal 
amount of $100,000, with the 
certificates of obligation of 
each such series or issue, 
respective ly , to mature 
serially within not to exceed 
40 years from their date, and 
to be sold at such prices and 
bear interest at such rates as 
shall be determined within 
the discretion of the City 
Council, for the purpose of 
purchasing land for the 
waste water treatment plant 
and to pay engineering, 
fiscal and legal fees, and 
shall said City Council be 
authorized to levy and cause 
to be assessed and collected 
annual ad valorem taxes in 
an amount sufficient to pay 
the annual interest on said 
bonds and provide a sinking 
fund to pay said certificates 
of obligation at maturity, 
with said certificates of 
obligation to be additionally 
secured by and payable from 
the revenues of the City’s 
W aterw orks and Sewer 
System after payment of all 
operation and maintenance 
expenses thereof.
And connection with all of 
the City’s revenue bonds 
i now or hereater outstnding) 
which are payable from all 
or any part of the New 
Revenues of the C ity ’ s 
W aterw orks and Sewer 
System?

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
Shall the City Council of 

said City be authorized to 
issue the bonds of said City, 
in one or more series or 
issues, in the aggegate prin­
cipal amount of $475,(XX), 
with the bonds of each such 
series or issue, respectively, 
to mature serially within not 
to exceed 40 years from their 
date, and to be sold at such 
prices and bear interest at 
such rates as shall be 
detemined within the discre­
tion of the City Council, for 
the purpose of improving 
and extending the Sewer 
System of said City, and 
shall said City Council be 
authorized to levy and cause 
to be assessed and collected 
annual ad valorem taxes in 
an amount sufficient to pay 
the annual interest on said 
bonds and provide a sinking 
fund to pay said bonds'ilt 
maturity?

PROPOSITION NO. 3
Shall the City Council of 

said City be authorized to 
issue the bonds of said City, 
in one or more series or 
issues, in the aggregate prin­
cipal amount of $100,000, 
with the bonds of each such 
series or issue, respectively, 
to mature serially within not 
to exceed 40 years from their 
date, and to be sold at such 
prices and bear interest at 
such rates as shall be deter­
mined within the discretion 
of the City Council, for the 
purpose of improving and 
extending the Wate System 
of said City, with said bonds 
to be secured by and payable 
from a lien on and pledge of 
the Net Revenues of said Ci­
ty’s Waterworks and Sewer 
System’

7. That the official ballots 
for said election shall be 
prepared in accordance with 
the Texas Election Code so 
as to permit the electors to 
vote FOR” or •AGAINST” 
the aforesaid PROPOSI­
TIONS, with the ballots to 
contain such provisons, 
markings and languaage as 
required by law, and with 
such PROPOSITIONS to be 
expressed substantially as 
follows:

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
P'ORl lAG AlNSfi I THE IS­
SU AN CE  OF $100,000 
SEW ER SYSTEM COM­
B IN A T IO N  T A X  AND  
R E V E N U E  C E R ­
TIFICATES OF OBUGA- 
TION

PROPOSITION NO. 2 
FOR( lAGAINSTi ) THE IS­
SU AN CE  OF $475.000 
SEW E R SYSTE M  TA X  
BONDS

PROPOSITION NO. 3 
FOR( iAGAINSTi ) THE IS­
SU AN CE OF $100,000 
W A T E R  S YSTE M
REVENUE BONDS.

8. That this Ordinance is 
hereby declared to be an 
emergency ordinance effec­
tive upon first passage by 
the City Council since it 
relates to the immediate 
preservation of the public 
peace, health, safety and 
welfare, and it is necessary 
that an improvement pro­
gram be started immediate­
ly to improve the City’s 
Water and Sewer System.

First grad ‘doctors’ in Cisco
I t  was mostly a matter o f coincidence, 

says Dr. Ervin Addy, that he received the 
first diploma from Southwestern Medical 
College. He’d decided to suy and finish his 
senior year at the new medical school 
instead o f follow ing Baylor Medical School 
to Houston. Roll call was always in alpha­
betical order, so he was always first on the 
list

All the coincidences came together in 
March 1944 when he became the first 
member o f Southwestern’s first graduating 
class to receive his medical degree.

The historic document hangs in his office 
in Cisco, Texas. The certificate is surprisingly 
unpresumptuous; the ink is ligh t and the 
paper has turned gray. It is an unassuming 
di^lay, at best But it symbolizes the reason 
for Southwestern’s being; to train physicians.

Addy is admittedly proud to have had 
such a symbolic part in the history of the 
school However, it is his almost 40 years as 
a family practitioner that leaves the strong­
est impression o f  Southwestern’s success at 
training doctors

Cisco IS a quiet little place about 30 
minutes from Abilene. Addy and his family 
settled in the W est Texas town after he 
finished a nine-month internship in San 
Antonio. There were three doctors when 
he arrived, but this number gradually de­
creased. He remembers a one-year stretch 
when he was the only doctor the town had 
He and another doctor now practice in 
Cisco, but he says more doctors are needed.

Addy takes appointments, but walk-ins 
still make up the majority o f his business 
Before he could begin this Center Times 
interview, he was called away to put several 
stitches in the chin o f  a 10-year-old who’d 
slipped and cut herself in the p o o l After 
taking care o f  that emergency, he settled 
back for about an hour and reminisced 
about his early medical experiences When 
the interview was over, a front office filled 
with patients awaited him.

Whether past or present, Addy says medh 
cine, for him, has always been doctoring 
the aches and injuries o f  people. ’ ’The 
kinds o f  things doctors see and treat 
haven’t changed that much,” he says There 
are still chins to stitch, babies to deliver, 
infections to treat The changes have come 
in new techniques and approaches

In terms o f  medical education, he says 
hardly anything is the same anymore” Medi­
cal school was never like it is now. There’ s a 
heap o f difference in the curriculum. N ow  
students can pick and choose what they 
want to concentrate on after they finish 
their basic courses 'They can take lecture

service and attend class when they want to 
... this is all very different W e had to attend 
class and we all took the same courses ”

Addy vividly remembers another part o f 
his traimng that no longer exists the outside 
obstetrics rotation. “ W e went into homes 
to deliver babies. Our patients were pri­
marily poor, black women in West and 
South Dallas. But we also had some in the 
servants’ quarters in Highland Park. It was 
quite an experience.”

America was at war when Addy was in 
school and just about everyone enrolled 
was in a military program o f some kind. ” I 
don't know that anybody had to be in the 
military, but they paid our tuition and gave 
us a subsistence. All we had to do was show 
up for roll call each morning. There were 
some that were chronically tardy. I can still 
see them come running up, screeching to a 
halt

” W e had to march some, too. You should 
see doctors march.”

Oral quizzes ” on everything” were also 
common. ” 1 can remember one faculty 
member who asked questions just to get 
vou out on a limb, and then he’d cut o ff the 
limb. The quizzes got pretty tough at 
times.”

When you ask him about the physical 
changes between the campus in ’4 3 and the 
campus today, Addy just laughs. ” What 
campus.^ W hen Baylor left, we didn’ t really 
have one. W e were spread out all over. The 
faculty made arrangements for us to meet 
at different places. W e ’d check a bulletin 
board in the old Parkland building to find 
out where to go  n ex t”

But Addy says even the confusion over 
where to meet was better than what he and 
his classmates had been used to. ’ ’ The old 
buildings were terrible. I can remember 
one lecture hall where the dogs were kept 
on the second floor. W e ’d meet for class on 
the first floor, and the fleas and Uce would 
drop on us during lecture. Things weren’ t 
real good. ”

Addy says if there are any similarities 
between his medical school years and 
medical school today, they probably rest in 
the nature o f  the students themselvea 
Having seen the 1983 Senior Film during a 
campus visit for the Southwestern Alumni 
reunion, he recalls his class’ s own theatrical 
endeavors. ’ ’The senior film reminded me 
o f our student plays. They were also takeoffs 
on whatever was currently popular, our 
teachers and so on. They were a little raw in 
spots, but everybody seemed to enjoy thera”

Fraternities were popular when he was in 
school and played a major role in the

Erf<tn Addy, M. D
students’ social life. Although not so active 
as the fraternities o f days gone by, the Phi 
Beta Pis do have a chapter at Southwestern. 
Their group is responsible for events like 
the annual Southwestern Chili Cook-Off.

” I was a Phi Beta; our fratertuty probably 
made up more than half of the school 
There were also Phi Chi’ s. Mostly these 
were people who’d done their premedical 
training at Baylor University in Waco. 
When the medical school moved, most o f

their fraternity went too.
” Back then we also had fraternity houses. 

They were essentially boarding houses, but 
we’d have big parties there on the weekends. 
Our old fraternity house was where the 
Baylor School o f  Nursing now sunds”  

Flipping through his yearbook, remem­
bering the faces o f classmates and faculty 
members, Addy’ s memories made South­
western’s first year come back to life. His 
memories touched on good times, bad 
times and confusing times. ” W e made it 
through It a ll we never doubted our school 
would be good  Most o f  us saw the changes 
as changes for the better. Looking back on 
It now, it is clear that they were. ” 

Southwestern Medical College’s first 
diploma IS Ervin Addy’s personal chunk o f 
history. And the Southwestern symbol daily 
grows stronger with each patient he treils 
in Cisco, Texas.

Uz M'dldtng
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D | legal notices . . I
AVISO DE ELECCION 

E L ESTADO DE TEXAS 
\ CONDADO DE EASLAND 

CIUDAD DE CISCO 
AL RESIDENTE, ELEC­

TORES CAUFICADOS DE 
DICHA CIUDAD;

SE IJ=:S HACE SABER, 
que una elección tomara 
lugar en dicha Ciudad como 
se e.«tipula enla ORDENAN­
ZA LLA M A N D O  A LA 
EIJICCION, cual Ordenanza 
fue debidamente dada por el 
Consejo Municipal de dicha 
Ciudad, cual Ordenanza dice 
su bstan c ia lm en te  lo 
siguiente.
ORDENANZA LLAMANDO 

IJ\ EI,ECCION 
ESTADO DE TEXAS 
CONDADO DE EASTIAND 
CIUDAD DE CISCO 

VISTO QUE, se juzga 
necesario y aconsejable 
llamar la elección ordenada 
mas adelante; y 

VISTO QUE, por este 
medio, oficialmente se en­
cuentra y se determina que 
existe un caso de emergen­
cia od de necesidad publica 
urgente el cual requiere 
tener lugar una reunion en la 
cual esta Ordenanza se ha de 
pasar, tal emergencia or 
necesidad publica urgente 
siendo que los faiidos de la 
venta de los bonos pro­
puestos son requeridos lo 
mas pronto posible y sin 
retrasos para mejoramien­
tos públicos urgentes y 
necesarios; y que dicha reu­
nion fue abierta al publico, y 
aviso publico de la hora, el 
lugar, y el proposito de dicha 
reunion fue dada, todo como 
estipulado por Vernon's Ann. 
Civ. St. Articulo 6252-17.
POR CONSIGUIENTE. SE 
ORDENA POR EL CONSE­
JO M UNICIPAL DE LA 
CIUDAD DE CISCO;

1. Que una elección tomara 
lugar 19 de noviembre de 
1983, en dicha Ciudad, en el 
siguente lugar de votación;

CORRAL ROOM, VICTOR 
HOTEL, 400 AVEN’ ’ C D,
a s c o  TEX.\:i

Dicha Ciudad constituirá 
un solo recinto de elección 
para dicha eleco>-r., y los 
siguientes oficiales de elec­
ción están por este medio 
nombrados para conducir 
dicha elección - 

Juez A ctu an te : M .L . 
Bailey

Suplente del Juez Ac­
tuante; Margaret Torres

2. Que el Juez Actuante 
nombrara no menos de tres 
o fic ia le s  de e lecc ión  
calificados para servir y 
asistir en el conducto de 
dicha elección; con tal que si 
e l Juez Actuan te a c ­
tualm en te s ir v e  como 
suponido, el Suplente del 
Jeuz Actuante sera uno de 
dichos oficiales.

3. Que al aprobar y firmar 
esta Ordenanza el Alcalde de 
dicha Ciudad oficialmente 
confirma su nombramiento 
de los antesdicho oficiales de 
elección para servir en dicha 
elección; y al pasar esta 
Ordenanza el cuerpo gover- 
nante de dicha Ciudad 
aprueba y concurre con el 
nom bram iento  de los 
antesdichos oficiales de elec­
ción.

4. Que todos los residentes, 
electores ca lifidacos de 
dicha Ciudad tengan derecho 
a votar en dicha elección.

5. Que se dara noticia de 
dicha elección por medio de 
poner una copia fidedigna de 
esta Ordenanza en la Casa 
Municipal y en dos otros 
lugares en dicha Ciudad, no 
menos de 15 dias antes de la 
fecha fijada para dicha elec­
ción; y una copia fidedigna 
de esta Ordenanza también 
sera publicada el mismo día 
en cada una de dos .semanas 
consecutivas en un periódico 
de c ircu lac ión  genera l 
publicada en dicha Ciudad; 
la fecha de la primera 
publicación sera no menos 
de 14 días antes de la fecha 
fijada dicha elección.

6. Que en tal elección las 
s igu ien tes P R O P O S I­
CIONES serán sometidas de 
acuerdo con la lev;

PROPOSICION NUM. 1
D eberá  el Consejo 

Municipal de dicha Ciudad 
ser autorizado de emitir los 
certificación de obligación 
de dicha Ciudad en una o 
mas series o emisiones, en el 
monto principal agregado de

wvli U-U

para pagar estipendios de in­
geniería, fiscales y legales, y 
deberá  ta l Consejo 
Municipal ser autorizado de 
gravar y dar causa para 
avalorar y recaudar im­
puestos anuales ad valoren 
en una cantidad suficiente 
par pagar el interes anual 
sobre dichos certificación de 
Obligación y proveer una ca­
ja de amortización para 
pagar dichos certificación de 
Obligación a vencerse, con 
tales certificación de obliga­
ción a ser adicionaomente 
asegurados y pagables por 
los ingresos del Sistema de 
Abastecimiento de Agua y de 
Goacas después del pago de 
todos los gastos del funciona­
miento y mantenimiento de 
eso y todo otro servicio de 
deuda y otros requisitos en 
conexión con todos los bonos 
de ingreso de la Ciudad 
(ahora o pendiente en lo 
fu turo) los cuales son 
pagables de todo Abasteci­
m iento de Agua y de 
Cloascas?

PROPOSm ON NUM. 2
D eberá  el Consejo 

Municipal de dicha Ciudad 
ser autorizado de emitir los 
bonos de dicha Ciudad, en 
una or mas series or emi­
siones, en el monto principal 
agregado de $475,(H)0 con los 
bonos de cada tal serie o 
emisión, respectivamente, a 
vencerse por serie dentro de, 
pero no excediendo 40 anos 
desde su fecha, y ser ven­
didos a tales precios y pro- 
duui inlcrvD a dicho valor 
como sea determinado a la 
d iscrec ión  del Consejo 
Municipal, con el fin de me­
jorar y extender el Sistema 
de A bastec im ien to  de 
Cloacas de dicha Ciudad, y 
sera dicho Consejo
) M U l l t C Í p u .  U M b U i  1 a. o  U  U U

gravar y dar causa a gravar 
y colectar impuestos ad 
valorem anuales en una can­
tidad suficiente para pagar 
el ínteres anual de dichos 
bonos y para establecer un 
fondo de amortización para 

..dv
• de Obligación de cada tal 
sene o emisión, respec­
tivamente. a vencerse por 
sene dentro de, pero no ex- 
•'ediendo 40 unos dude .'U 
fecha, y ser vendidos a tales 
precios y pro<lucir interest a 
dicho valor como sea deti i - 
minada a la discreción del 
Consejo Municipal, con el fin 
de comprar sitios para plan- 
• I 'te purificaci'

venzan
PROPOSICION NUM 3
D eberá  el Consejo 

Munici|ial de dicha Ciudad 
ser aului izado de emitir los 
bonos de cada tal sene o 
enusion, respectivamente, a 
'■onrorcp nor .serie d e n t r o  d e  

pero no i.xiedienau 40 anos 
desde su fecha, y ser ven­
didos a tales precios y pro 
ducii iiiteret a dicho valor

como sea determinada a la 
d iscreción  del Consejo 
Municipal, con el fin de me­
jorar y extender el Sistema 
Municipal de Abastecimien­
to de Agua, y dichos bonos 
sera asegurados y pagado 
por un gravament de y una 
promesa de las rentas 
publicas de los Ingresos 
Netos del S istem a de 
Abastecimiento de Agua y de 
Goacas?

7. Que las balotas oficiales 
para dicha elección sean 
preparadas de acuerdo con 
el Codigo de Elección de 
Texas para asi permitir a los 
e le c to re s  de vo ta r  ‘ A 
FAVOR”  o “ EN CONTOA”  
en las ya menchionadas 
PROPOSiaONES con que 
las balotas tengan dichas 
estipulaciones, marcas y ter­
minologia estipulada por la 
ley, y que tales PROPOSI­
C IO NES sean substan­
cialmente expresadas corro 
lo giguiente ;

PROPOSIGON NUM. 1 
A f a v o r ì  )EN CONTRAf ) 
LA EMISION DE CER­
TIFICACION DE OBUGA- 
a O N  DE COMBINAGON 
DE IMPUESTOS E IN ­
GRESOS DE $100,000 PARA 
SISTEMA DE CLOACAS

PROPOSIGON NUM. 2 
A f a v o r ì  )EN CONTRA í ) 

EMISION DE BNOS DE 
IM PUESTO DE $475,000 
P A R A  S IS T E M A  DE 
A B A S T E C IM IE N T O  DE 
AGUA

PROPOSICION NUM. 3 
A FAVORÌ )EN CONTRAí 
llJV EMISION DE BONOS 
DE INGRESOS DE $100,000 
P A R A  SISTEM /i DE 
A B A S T E C IM IE N T O  DE 
AGUA

8. Que esta Ordenanza esta 
por este medio declarada a 
ser una ordenanza de 
emergencia efectiva al ser 
primeramente aprobada por 
el Consejo Municipal pro- 
ques es relativo a ¡a preser­
vación immediate de la tran­
quilidad, salud, sequridad y 
bienestar publico, y es 
necesario empezar un pro­
gram a de m e joras in- 
mediatan'ente para mejorar 
el Sistema de Alw.stet unien- 
to de Agua y de Goacas

Financial 
Seminar Set 
At Chamber

Ted Paup, President of 
Financial Perspectives will 
be giving a Seminar Thurs­
day night October 20, 1983 at 
7:00 at the Cisco Chamber of 
Commerce. This Seminar is 
a service to the community 
There will be no charge for 
this one night seminar 
Anyone interested in atten­
ding is welcome to attend. 
For more information call 
(915 ) 673-1042 or 442-2537

e je  Student 
Government 
Names Officers

Cisco Junior College Stu­
dent Government Associa­
tion officers for the 1983-84 
year are Tinker Ham, presi­
dent. Blanket; Terry Bean, 
treasurer. Plains. Brad 
Butler of Merkel was ap­
pointed parliamentarian.

Sophmore class officers 
are Butch Rich, president, 
Graham; Nancy Butler, vice 
president, Merkel; l^qev 
O liv e r . s e c re ff iry ,
Jacksboro ; and K e lle  
Burnett, treasurer, Merkel. 
I,eonard Garces of Eastland 
and John Blankenship of 
Sonora were appointed 
senators.

Freshman class officers 
are Delbert McNeil, presi-

Cisco A ARP  

Will Meet 
Thursday At 6

The Cisco Chapter of the 
American Association of 
Retired Persons will hold its 
monthly meeting on Thurs­
day, October 20, beginning at 
6;00 p.m. with the usual 
covered dish supper The 
meeting is held in the Corral 
Room.

Program speaker will be 
Mrs Maria Duncan from the 
Eastland o ffice  of the 
D epartm en t of Human 
Resources. As a Social 
Worker, Mrs. Duncan is 
specifically involved in ser­
vices to the aged and disabl­
ed.

P res id en t W alter 
K now lden  urges a ll 
members to be present 
Am ong top ics fo r  the 
business session will be the 
report of the Nominating 
Committee of slate of of­
ficers for 1984 to 1985.

( ‘f

/   ̂ »

] %

JANA JEFFCOAT 
...class treasurer

dent, Abilene; Terrance 
Copling, vice president, 
Dallas; Tracy Matthews, 
secretary, Abilene; and 
Jana Jeff coat, treasurer, 
Cisco. Shela Hartsell of 
Ozan, Arkansas and Path 
Spurlcn of Eastland were ap­
pointed senators.

The Q tco P re is Sunday,
Octob«^ 16, 1983



Wranglers Win Over A&M J.V. 10-6
- u; l̂- K«; Momrin fr^m Q/'Aft PIIWAH tO Matt of M AttPmDtS.

The Wranglers of Cisco 
Junior College strengthened 
their season record to 5-2 
Thursday night in College 
Station where they defeated 
Texas A&M’s Junior Varsity 
by the score of IM .

Cisco threatened to score

early in the game on their 
first drive of the night. CJC 
fielded the ball and moved it 
downfield to A4M ’s one-yard 
line where it was fumbled 
and lost, killing the drive.

Neither team was able to 
score in the first quarter of 
play, but CJC got on the

scoreboard first with a 
30-yard field goal by Walter 
Rule in the second quarter of 
play.

A&M came back in the 
same quarter and scored on 
a one-yard run by Sonny 
Harmon. The extra point

CISCO EVENING Lions Club boss Al Young is shown as he prepares to 
“ stir a bowl of chili”  as second vice president Clyde Sublet! and District 
2-El Governor Archie Chamness react. Little Marty Sublet! also helps out 
the group.

Evening Lions Club Will 
Sponsor Chili Supper

When things heat up at
7:30 p.m. on the Chesley

Field gridiron, Cisco Lobo 
and Eastland Mavericks

1st Industrial Arts Club Meets
The First Industrial Arts 

Qub met for their regular 
monthly meeting October 6, 
1983. Guest speaker, Nancy 
C lark , R .N ., E astland . 
Texas, gave an informative 
slide presentation and com­
mentary on Home Health 
Care. During the business 
meeting that followed the

p rog ram , plans w ere 
discussed for the Diamond 
Jubilee Anniversary of the 
club to be celebrated in 
N ovem b er . The next 
meeting will be October 21, 
1983, with club member 
Evelyn Fry in charge of the 
program entitled, A Touch of 
FaU.

The O sco Press
Sunday,

October 16, 1983

fans can be “ warm and full”  
next Friday night.

The Cisco Evening Lions 
Club is sponsoring a Chili 
Supper, scheduled from 5-7 
p.m. in the Cisco High School 
Cafeteria.

Tickets for the event are 
on sale all this week from 
members of the club. Ccst of 
the Uckets is $2.50. Tickets 
will also be available at the 
door.

Desserts will be available 
to go with the chill. Tickets 
will also be available at the 
door.

A1 Young is president of 
the Cisco Evening Lions 
Club.

kick was blocked by Marvin 
Williams making the half­
time score 6-3 in favor of 
A m .

Cisco came back in the 
third quarter of play and 
scored  the ir w inning 
touchdown on a 12-yard pass

Girl Scout 
Troop Leaders 

WiU Meet Mon.
Brownwood G irl Scout 

Staff members will be in 
Cisco Monday night, October 
17 to hold the first basic 
oreientation for new Girl 
Scout troop leaders This 
session will be held .it the 
First National Bank Com­
munity Room at 7:00 p.m.

Although this first session 
is intended specifically for 
troop leaders, service team 
members are welcome.

The regular Association 
Meeting and orientation ses­
sion for S erv ice  Team  
Members will be held on 
Monday night, October 24, at 
the Community Room of 
First National Bank at 7:00 
p.m.

Auxiliary Of 
Ho§pital Plans 

Meet Oct. 17
The E.L. Graham Hospital 

Auxiliary w ill have its 
regular meeting on Monday, 
October 17th at 2:00 at the 
hospital. President Kitty Mc­
Cracken will preside at the 
meeting; program chair­
man, Polly Wright will in­
troduce the speaker for the 
meeting -  Joe Cooper, who 
will speak on “ Drug Abuse in 
Eastland County” .

A report of the Book Fair 
which was held on October 
14-15 will be given by co­
chairpersons Lois Adling 
and Pearl Honea. The Aux­
iliary always welcomes new 
m em b ers -a c tive  or 
associate. The dues for an 
acitve member are $3 and $5 
for an associate. Ruth 
H eiden h eim er is the 
membership chairman of 
the Auxiliary. Visitors are 
w elcom e to attend the 
meeting and “ see what the 
organization is all about.”

from Scott Ellison to Matt 
Simpson. The extra point 
kick by Rule was good mak­
ing the score 10-6.

Texas A&M’s J.V. receiv­
ed the football in the final 
seconds of the game on 
Cisco’s end of the field 
around the 20-yard line 
where they had four tries for 
a touchdown. CJC 's 
Reginald Shannon, a 6*3” , 
240-pound, sophomore defen­
sive tackle from Dallas, 
helped stop their chances at 
a score when he sacked the 
quarterback for losses on 
two of their four tries.

Besides Shannon, CJC 
coaches also named Kelvis 
Mangrum as a defensive 
standout. Mangrum is a 
freshman defensive back 
from  J a ck son v ille . He 
stands at 5'10”  and weighs 
175 pounds.

Cisco’s defense only allow­
ed Texas A&M’s J.V. ten 
first downs during the game, 
along with 79 yards rushing 
and 119 passing. The CJC 
defense helped to keep 
A&M’s pass completions at 6

of 33 attempts.
Offensively, Cisco gained 

67 yards rushing and 186 
yards passing during Thurs­
day night’s game.

Fund Set tip 

For Baker 

Infant Here
A fund has been set up for 

Clint Travis Baker, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Baker of 
Cisco at the First National 
Bank of Cisco. Clint was 
bom September 25, 1983 in 
H endricks H osp ita l in 
Abilene with congenial heart 
disease. He was transferred 
to Ft. Worth Children’ s 
Hospital where he under­
went surgery last Tuesday. 
He is still having tests.

Mr. and Mrs. Baker have 
no insurance and they are 
having to travel back and 
forth to Ft. Worth to be with 
Clint.

They have one other son, 
Roy, age 7 at home.

iW
BURGESS INDUSTRIES has selected Paul 

Lavender as Employee of the Month of 
September. He has been employed at Burgess 
since January of 1980. Paul is classified as 
material handler. His duties include control 
and organization of the metal yard and of the 
finished goods yard. He is a valuable asset at| 
the plant. Paul was awarded a $50 gift cer­
tificate from Sears, (staff photo)

THE F IT  AND 
Burgess Industries 
Department of the

WELD Department 
has been selected as

__ ,_________ Month for September.
Employees of the department are shoMm in the 
above picture: Ralph Ramerlz (department 

^ e a d ) ,  John Torres, Danny Hobbs, Rudy

Gevera, Rick Browder, James Weiser, Jack 
Merrill, Fred Hernandez Sr. and Ray Maples. 
The company is proud of this department for 
the good work that brought this honor, (staff 
photo)

Music Study Club Holds Meeting October 12th

YOU NEED A TV CAiilE CONNEaiON 
• for complett taUviiion anjoymaiit 

★  ★  ★

Southern Television Systems Corpi
Serving Gtco, E o ttM l, Rongor 

Coll us for complete mformotion

When Your Septic Tank Needs
Cleaning call Bill Lewis for

Dependable Service at a Pair Price.
Save This Ad for a 5̂  ̂ Discount 

on first Cleaning
Lewis Septic Tank Service

Dr. CM . d G.S. Cleveland's Office will

I ‘ be Closed from Friday Afternoon, Oct. 7

until Monday, Oct. 17.
Dr. Harris' Office will Continue Normal 

Hours
602 Are, f. Osco 442-1166

La Potpourri Gift & Hobby Shop
501 S. Daugherty Eastland 

629-3222
. Tuesday 7-10 FREE Ceramic Oottes 

Al type of KHs New Gift Hems
S9( Fbwer Airangements ChHdrens Jewelry

TC

By Vida Killlon
The Cisco Music Study 

Club, members of the Texas 
Federation of Music Gubs, 
met Wednesday, October 12, 
at 10:00 a.m . in the 
Federated Gub House.

Mrs. J.C. Dyer, president, 
called the meeting to order. 
Mrs. Hal Lavery gave the in­
vocation.

M rs. Ben K rauskop f, 
secretary-treasurer, read

minutes of the May meeting. 
She made the following nota­
tions: Membership dues are 
paid; the Gub plans to com­
plete the current Course of 
Study Book this club year. 
She presented new year 
books to members. The 
books were printed by Bill 
Roberts. Viola Payne made 
a motion to pay the printing 
cost. Mrs. Hal Lavery gave a 
second to the motion. Motion

in te n z ^ o u r Cor Now at
M Texoco

1-20 & Rising Star Hwy. G sco
Radiator Flushed 

Antifreeze Replaced for
only ^  P4t

carried.
Mrs. Dyer gave an indepth 

review of the function of the 
Federated Music Club«. In 
the United States there are 
four regions: Western, Cen­
tra l, N ortheastern  and 
Southeastern. Within regions 
we have Districts. We are in 
the Central Region. Our area 
is ca lled  the Te- 
xas/Oklahoma D is tr ic t. 
Texas is divided into 12 
Districts. We are in the 
Third District. Mrs. J.C. 
Dyer, president of the Cisco 
MSC and the Third District, 
also se rves  in S tate 
capacities as State Historian 
and Chairman of Magazine 
and Literature Promotion. 
She attended the TFMC 
Board meeting at the Holi­
day Inn Country V illa , 
Midland, Texas, September 
15-17.

Each  State send a 
representative to National.

T O  I  ¿ * f f O / ^ S T l J J i )

St*T c o itu s  — VIÌ4YL TOPS 

CARPE’ S HOAl SEATb 

FREE ESTIMATES 

C ISC O  AUTO T tIM

Hwy ao w »,t -- C lOO

1 Í
WILLIAM
JOHNSON

H A R G R A V E  IN S U R A N C E

AGENCY
IIM Ave.D  
Cisco , Tex

Persend Sdei A Service For 
NOME liiturmice 
Cor Insureiice

^ CommercM lusineM Insurance 
MoMe Nome Insurance A Travel Traiers 

— loot Insurance 
1̂  Ufe Imurapce 
intends Of AR Kinds

SMvfuy A.Norgrove-.
442-1477 Or 442-1059

)p4t4n|t4ii|cd4 i4t4i4t4i4c4 i d4c4i4i4c4c4c4(i|c4c4K4(

«GoMitood Gowwittod J
$ Professional $
$ Noil Sculpturing t
$  Why Not Have Long Beautiful J  
$  Noils? t
$ B y  Appointment Only 442-4914 *

Back Hoe Service
Kirby Welding 

Call
442-3721

Day or Night Cisco, Texas
Steam Cleaning Service 

A Welding Also

Mory Kay Cosmetics
For O pnvoi*

f ifT F P

(U.P.C.)

Now ovoilobl* in Cisco
COmplim*n‘ iry laciol or r»ord«r coll

ViRGIE GREGG g-
¡^ î̂ PROFESSIONAl BEAUn CONSULTANT ^  

1 442-346

by the

kiREATER MOUNTAIN TOP 
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH

/ I I  P  r

Lo atteacl •••
★  A  “Biblc-PreacKing** CKufc^

★  A  “Friendly Church’

★  A  “Spirit-FUled'
Church

ir A  Church Where  
Christ Is Exaulted 
As “The Mighty 
God“

★  A  Church 
Where  
Miracles 
HappenI

John C. Jones 
Pastor

10 Milos South of Cisco on Hwy. 183

Regions m ay se lect a 
member to be sent to Na­
tional to be voted on as a 

-member at large. Out of this 
group, persons are chosen to 
compose a National Board of 
60 members.

Each  D is tr ic t  has 
American Music Giairman- 
ship congruent with the State 
and National Chairman­
ships.

TFM C  o ffe rs  awards, 
sch o larsh ips and en­
dowments.

The first to receive the 
J.C. Dyer, Jr. state violin 
award was 11 year old, 
Sylvia Bernard of Houston.

In the Scholarship for the 
Blind, FMC’s of this area 
had a part in sponsoring the 
now internationally known 
trumpeter, Stacy Blair.

Endowment Funds may be 
given entirely to National or 
a part may be reserved for 
Texas.

The Cisco MSC will pre­
sent M rs. L eo ta  B ar­
tholomew in Piano Recital, 
October 30, at 3:00 p.m. at 
the F irs t  P resb y te rian  
Church of Cisco.

Members voted to have 
programs, personal invita­
tions, napkins and name tags 
printed for the occasion. 
Member hostesses will serve 
refreshments.

Hymn of the month, "0  
Zion, Haste,”  was presented 
by Vida Killion. Mrs. Lynn 
Williams played the hymn.

Members present were 
Mrs. J.C. Dyer, Mrs. Ben 
K rau sk op f, M rs. Lynn 
Williams, Mrs. J.S. Mobley, 
Mrs. Viola Payne, Mrs. Hal 
L a ve ry  and M rs. O.T. 
Killion.c CARD

OF THANKS 3
I would like to take this op­

portunity to thank each and 
everyone who helped make 
the 1963 edition of the Moran 
Hranecoming and the towns 
Centennial Celebration sudi 
a success. Little praise is 
due at all to me, the pralae 
and my thanks goes to those 
who were responsible for the 
beautification of Moran and 
for taking care of the 
thousands of d e ta ils  
necessary to bring about this 
moat exciting weekend. For 
a brief nooment in time 
Moran was beautiful.

Robert C. Green

èa

i
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Newspaper Advertising 

Is Always Prime Time!

*3,331. In Abandoned Accounts Awaits Area Residents

wiuowooo ptopmiEs
Real Estate AbUene

EASTLAND

t  P dnn. booM, ip a c to u  U vlaf a rm  m  m  w m ,  I a l M  I r a n  EM lIaiid 

U r e  workihop, free g u  U  kamt, oat bulM lagt Ifwy. H  fro a la fc . « 0,W*.

CARBON

M l a r r e i, U rg e  boaie, picaty d  w ater la lla ble pcaaute aod g ra la i 
I U 47JI.

Tw o 3-b d m  taouMt, 1 aew , amt 7 yn  oM.

RANGER

a t  a e r n ,  b o aw , calU vatioa, baaUng good itech  te a k i. 

n  a r m ,  ru lU vateblt. oaHalbe T r ia s  V tl. loaa IT tt men 

KIrganI otdrr baow , approx 4Mn sg. H. a m a il te sac

ABILENE

Soutbsld«. Large liv lag  areas )  bdnns. lovely hodie

SoulhsM r. Good ite rte r  borne. I bdrm. MM M 's 
Pboac Mel or Roa Scalfe 

or IIM M -M U

Texas Treasu rer Ann 
Richards is looking for 
several Eastland County 
area residents who have a 
total of $3,331 coming to 
them from abandoned ac­
counts held in the State 
T reasu rers  U ncla im ed  
Money Fund.

Reports are submitted to 
the Treasurer each year by 
banks, savings and loan 
associations, credit unions, 
coporations, utility com­
panies, department stores

FOR SALE 
55-gallon 

ink
barrels 

with lids 
$25.00 each 

at the Telegram 
in Elastland.

KINCAID REAL ESTATE
100 S. Seam an A  9 0  1 7 f t 1
Eastlan d , T ex as 7 6 4 4 8  O  A  7  ■ I  #  O  I

RESIDENTIAL COMMERCIAL
IMr story 1400 sq. ft. comer lot excellent 
condition underground sprinkler 
system- Owner finance $55,000.00

The old Thrift Mart store on E. 00 in 
Eastland 9,000 ft. owner finance, 
possible lease with option to buy also.

Brick. 4 Bedroom 2 Bath Hobby Room, 
2200 sq. ft. good condition comer lot 
with storage building $50,000.00 Owner
Finance

ACREAGE
5 acres with water meter. V6 mile out of 
Ranger. $10,000. Owner finance.

Let Kincaid Real Estate give you a bid 
on building the exact home youwant 
where you want.

42.35 acres, owner finance, 
pasture land, $685.00/acre.

good

Frame, New 2 bedroom, 1 bath, 900 sq. 
ft., 1 car garage, $36,000.00

142 acres located on the southwest side 
of Elastland Lake with irrigated coastal 
fields with two bedroom home and 
miscellaneous equipment. $220,000 with 
owner financing.

5 Acres & 1750 Sq. Ft. Frame Home 3 
Bedroom 2 Bath in Morton VaUey 
Owner’s Finance $58,500

35 acres between Eastland and Cisco 
just <rff of Hwy 80 on spur with city 
water, cable tv, will split down to 5 acre 
tracts.

Wb kavB M vtnil othtr listings
• 4* - , t O

H you know whnt you want, cnil us ond lot us find it for it
a U  MI..I A .U .4  .J«.

Robert M. KiiKoid 
(Broker)

Guy Kincaid 
(817) 629-1804 IQUAl N O O M  

i T u a n k iopeoRTuar

BIG  C O U N T R Y  R E A L  E STA TE
so* I. Ml

Cteco. T m a  TA4S7

442-1693
HOMES

2 BD Frame with formal dining room NOW ONLY $11.500 00 
2 BO X-tra neat, remodelled, insulated, new siding, fireplace, shop & garage.
2 BO large shady corner lot. storm cellar, garden, carport. $19.000
2 BD large shady corner lot. minor work turns this into great older home.
3 BD. 1 Bath, new kitchen, dining room, carport, on quiet street. $23.500.
3 BD. 2 Bath. 2 fireplaces, needs repair, large metal workshop REASONABLY PRICED.
3 BO. corner lot. Cent HA. live in the country while in town $25.000 
3 BO. Cent HA comfortable home on corner, storage garage
3 BD. TLC will enhance this home GREAT LOCATION!
4 BD on paved street, spacious kitchen, carport, shade trees corner lot
4 BD 2 Bath on 3 lots, modern kitchen, bar. PRICED REDUCED TO $32.500
Brick 2 BD. 1 SOLD ced yard, garage cozy starter home
Brick 3 BD. 2 Bath. 2 lots, fe S O l » D  -ms. fireplace corner lot
OLD FASHIONED CHARM 3 BO. 1 Bath Brick, hardwood floors, sunporch. 2 car garage with
plenty of storage. A QUALITY HOME in a FINE NEIGHBORHOOD'
M OBILE 3 BD. 2 Bath built on living room and storage, corner $15.500 
PUTNAM  - partially remodelled. 2 fireplaces. 2 lots garden spot $15 500

LOTS AND ACREAGES

73 AC 3 BD. 2 Bath, with office, fireplace pool many X tra features & minerals 
2.68 AC. fenced, out buildrngs. carport lovely 2 BO home with room to expand.
3 AC 3 BO. stone, with fireplace. Cent HA. plus 1 BO guest house
116 AC. CROSS PLAINS - BRICK HOME 2 Bath Cent HA. patio extra garage storage
wells, sheds, paved road, garden LOVELY FARM
51 Ac Southwest of Scranton All minerals. ONLY $30.601.00 Ì

LAKE PROPERTY

NORTHSIDE- 2 BO. 1 Bath. Goodwater. $16.000 Owner carry with $3.500 down 
LANDSCAPED ON SOUTH LAKE CISCO 2 BD Mobile Home with dock, only $12.500 
South Side Lake Home with guest house, boat house, many extras. REDUCED!!
North Side • Lovely home on deepwater, dock, patios fireplaces 3 Baths, IDEAL RETREAT! 
Ready to move in!
Northside 2 BO. A-Frame Boathouse, owner carry

Penny A. Reay 442-1707 OFFICE 442-1693 Dana Goosen, Broker 442-3958
Jeffrey Whiteside 643-3129

WE HAVE MORE LISTINGS - CALL US FOR YOUR REAL ESTATE NEEDS! i

and other businesses. Types 
of property included on the 
reports include checking and 
savings accounts, utility 
deposits, money orders and 
cashiers checks, corporated 
dividends, mineral royalties, 
credit balances on charge 
accounts, proceeds from in­
surance policies and gift cer­
tificates - all of which have 
been unclaimed or abandon­
ed for seven years. Under 
Texas  law , the State 
Treasurer is responsible for 
holding accounts and other 
types of property which have 
been unclamied or abondon- 
ed for seven years. Each ac­
count must have at least $50 
in it.

Area names on the list in­
clude the following:

Carbon - William Fleming.
Cisco - Elizabeth Lennon, 

Mrs. Brunte Plumlee, and 
Kirk Wallace.

Eastland - J .L . Cot- 
tingham , H aro ld  L. 
Ferguson, Bertha Hageman,

and J.R. Wood.
Anyone who sees their 

name on the list or thinks

they have abandoned ac­
counts from pervious years, 
should w rite  to S tate

Treasurer Ann Richards, 
P.O. Box 12608, Capitol Sta­
tion, Austin, Texas 78711; or

they may call the Treaaury’s 
toll-free hotline after Oct. 16 
at 1-80M21-CASH.

and F. Traywick.
Moran - Yancy J. McCrea 

and H.H. Wagley.
Ranger - D.F. Brashears, 

Glenn Voy Hammer, J.M. 
Robinson, Hillary Vasquez,

KING INSURANCE AGENCY REAL ESTATE
207 MAUN RANGER Phone; 647-1171

THREE STORY brick building, includes 2 offices (now 
rented) Four furnished apartments and plenty of space 
for business expansion. Owner will finance.
FOUR BEDROOM, 2 bath, asbestos siding, large kitchen, 
living room, cloee in $22,500 W Finance.
NICE 3 bedroom dwelling, 2 baths, garage and storage. 1 
bedroom mobile home, all on 3 lots with beautiful oak 
trees, $30,000.
GOOD COM MERCUL BUSINESS; 8 mobile homes and 2 
additional apartments on 74 fenced lots. All rented and 
good income. COME SEE US!
BEAUTIFUL 3 bedroom home. Urge den, IW baths, utili­
ty, greenhouse, 2-car garage, new custmn drapes, carept, 
fruit trees, all on fenced 2.6 acres. 1^,000.
THREE BDR., 1 bath, combined dining area and kitchen, 
carpet, panelled, chain link fenced yard on 5 lots. $20,000.
4 BOR., L.R., 2 iMth, carport, carpeted, also 2 bdrm. rent 
house. Large storage house, paved street. All on 6 lots.
$29,500
3 BDR., den, L.R., 2 bath, kitchen with built-ins. Study, 
firepUce, carpeted, shade trees, storage bldg., fenced in.
$49,500.

TWO BEDROOMS, living-dining room, kitchen, one bath, 
utility room, on 11 lots, needs repair. Also, newly 
decorated small one bedroom, living room, kitchen, bath.
All for $23,500 - Financing Available

Mrs. Opal C. King Lee Russell
647-1510 647-1383

NICE 3 BR, den, living room, dining area, new carpet, in­
sulated. 2 car garage and new patio. All on 7 plus lots,
close in. 136.000
THREE BEDROOM, two baths, utility, carpet, with small 
acreage, just out side of city limits.
TWO STORY, ten rooms, two baths, two nice lots, good 
neighborhood, needs repairs. Owner will diacuss price.

EASTLAND-three bedrooms, two baths, carpet, utility, 
newly decorated. Close in on good neighborhood, com­
pletely furnished. $40,(M0, owner will finance.
VERY NICE 2 story, 3 bdrm., 2 bath, knotty pine kitchen 
cabinets, built in dishwasher and oven, central heat, 
refrigerated air conditioners, ceiling fans, carport and 
garage, storm windows, 100 x 200 lot, good location.

STRAWN - Neat 2 hr.. Urge bath, living room, dining 
room, kitchen, utility room, carpet, paneled and in- 
suUted, asbestos cUd. $16,500. Owner will consider finan­
cing.
STRAWN - 2 story 5 Bdrm. - L.R., FirepUce, 4 attic 
closets kitchen, 1 Bath, some carpeted owner financed.

Don Adair 
629-2848

PAT M AYNARD REAL ESTATE
629-8568 EASTUND INT. 20 E. NORTH SIDE 442-1880 CISCO

Homuf: Entlund, Rongur and C«bo«
3 bedroom, 1 bath mobile home (12X65) on 

nice lot, total electric $8500.
A Urge 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home on 

two lots, 2car carport and storage, several 
trees. $28,500

2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home, deUebed 
garage and a new 25X40 metal building on 
concrete sUb $28,500

Beautiful 2 story brick home in OakhoUow,
4 bedroom, 3 baths, 2 half-baths, 3 car garage' 
with automatic door opener, kitchen has 
center LsUnd, 2 cook t ^ ,  Jennaire grill, 
microwave, trash compactor and double 
ovens, breakfast room, formal dining and liv­
ing rooms, gameroom and den, assumable 
loan, cull for appointment.

In Olden, 3 bedroom, 144 bath brick home on 
1 acre, carport, central heat/air, fruit trees.

. $52.500 .................. .. . . ,
Prestigious 2 story rock home on one of 

EastUnd’s finest streets. This is an excep­
tional home with approx. 5,000 sq. ft. and has 
all the extras including CH-CA, built-ins, 
trash compactor, intercom system, stereo 
hookups in each room, 2 car garage with elec­
tric door opener, drapes, fenced yard, and 
more. Definitely a quality place. CUll for ap­
pointment.

3 bedroom, 1 bath with ceiling fans, regrig, 
air, big oak trees and nice garden spot, plus a 
large workshop. $28,000.

Attention young couples: Good starter 
home, beats paying rent. 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
with detached garage. $18,000.

3 bedroom, 14 bath frame home on Urge 
lot, living/dining room area with firepUce, 
la rge kitchen with separate u tility , 
breezeway between garage, fruit trees. 
$30,000

3 bedroom, bath brick home on Urge lot.
Carpet, built-ins with central heat and air. 
$41,500.

3 bedroom, 1 bath 2 story frame home, 
separate living and den, large master 
bedroom and kitchen. $27,500

A 3 bedroom, 1®/« bath brick home in the 
desirable Crestwood addition. Urge living 
area with firepUce, beautifull lot. $77,000.

In Ranger, a beautiful stucco 3 bedroom, 1 
bath home, detached garage, storage 
buildings. $39,000.

In Gorman, 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home 
on 24 lots with separate garage and storage. 
$30,000.

Reasonably priced lots in nice area: $4500 
to $5500.

New homes in the exclusive Oakhollow ad­
dition. Call for an appointment.

A 2 bedroom, 1 bath home, formal dining 
area, CH-CA, carpeted, nice modem cabinets 
with dishwasher. $35,000.

Only 9 months old, this 3 bedroom, 1*4 bath 
brick home in exclusive area. Custom made 
drapes, fireplace, and other extras. $64,000.

A nice 3 bedroom, 1*4 bath brick home, 
separate living and den. $50,500

l^irge master bedroom in this 3 bedroom, 2 
bath home on one of our better streets, fur­
nished. Owner finance at 9^ interest. $40,000.

In Olden, we have a 2 bedroom, 1 bath older 
‘.hat needs some repairs. F’riced At $16,000.

In Ranger, a nice 3 bedroom, l ‘ i  bath brick 
home with carpet, drapes, CH-CA, fenced 
back yard, storage building. $47,000.

A very attractive 3 bedroom, 1*4 bath brick 
home with approximately 2200 sq. ft., two liv­
ing areas, each with fireplace, breakfast 
area, ceiling fans, built-ins, central heat/air. 
$82,500.

2 bedroom, 1 bath mobil home (14X56) im­
maculately kept, washer/dryer hook-up, and 
other extras $8500.

Smul Acruigt WMi Homtt
Outside Cisco, approx. 15-18 acres with very 

nice 3 bedroom, bath and a half double wide 
mobile home. Large carport. Big front deck. 
V« minerals. One water well and two tanks. 
Owner financing avaiUble at 10 / j.

24 acres on Staff road near Lake Leon with 
water well and tool liouse. Nice pUce for 
home. Only $6900.

640 acres approx. 17 miles northwest of 
Breckenridge with 2 bednwm, 1 bath frame 
house, 175 acres cultivation with remainder in 
pasture. 4574minerals with leasing rights. $583 
per acre.

160 acres oii  of Hwy. 183 eight miles south of 
Cisco, 100 acres culitivation, remainder trees. 
$600 per acre.

In Carbon, 3 bedroom, 1̂ 4 bath, rock home 
on 4 acres, shop, bam, fruit trees, $31,500.

In (Urbon, 9.3 acres with 3 bedroom, 14 
bath mobile home (12X65) located on Hwy. 6,
52 pecan trees, wells, beautiful pUce. $35,000.
(Will consider small down, remainder over 10 
years at 1 0 interest)

5.3 acres near Lake Leon with a 2 bedroom 
mobile home (14X70). Carpeted, central 
heat/air, house type windows, special siding, ..e . 
storage building and city water. $35,000.

16 acres near Eastland, with 1-20 frontage. 
$4,000 per acre. In 4 acre tracts $4500 per acre.

Located near Union Center: 2 bedroom 1 
bath home on approx. 38 acres. This house is a 
dream place in the country. $70,000.

A 3 bedroom, 24 bath, 2 story, approx. 3,000 
sq. ft. brick home only 3 years old situated on 
10 acres close to Eastland. Unique petrified 
wood fireplace. $105,000.

10 acres northwest of Cisco with city water 
and mobile home hook-up. Assumable loan. 
$ 12,000.

In Olden, a 2 story, 4 bedroom, 1 bath rock 
home on approx. 2 acres, detached garage, 
storage buildings, small bam, owner financed 
at 12*.,interest. $40,000.

FtfiNf A RowdiM
131 acres southwest of Cisco with 2 

bedroom, 14 bath frame home, cultivation 
and timber, 4 water wells, bams. Come 
m inerals. Owner financing ava ilab le. 
$160,000.

40 acres off 2526 out of Carbon, nearly all in 
love grass, some minerals. $900 per acre.

A hunter’s dream, this 150 acres south of 
CUirbon. 60 acres of cultivation, good fences 
and hunters shack. $600 per acre. Owner will 
finance.

40 acres located south of Cisco on 183 ., on 
1283, native pasture with scattered pecan 
trees, one well and tank, fenced (3) sides. 
$42,000

Near Eastland and Lake Leon, 49.6 wooded 
acres with six tanks and spring, on FM 2214, 
good place to hunt and fish, assumable loan. 
$60.000.

Neai Lake Leon, a 20 acre tract of land. 
Some cultivation and good hunting area. 
$30,000.

320 acres located between Carbon and Gor­
man. Some cultivation but mostly wooded. 
Good fences and hunting, some minerals in­
cluded; $500 per acre. Owner financed at 9*

5 acres near Eastland. 1-20 frontage. $5000 
per acre. Terms can be arranged.

Located south of Cisco, 50 acres with ap­
prox. 35 acres of pecan trees. Owner will con­
sider terms. $74,200.

Located south of Cisco, 50 acres with ap­
prox. 35 acres of pecan trees. Owner will con­
sider terms. $74400,

248 acres located on old Abilene Hwy. west 
of Cisco, mostly cleared with ome wooded 
acreage, good fences, 4  minerals with leas­
ing rights. $530 per acre.

100 acres between Lake Leon and 
Desdemona, all in cultivation and coastal. 
Good 5 wire fence and cross fence, shallow 
water, $800 per per acre. Owner finance at 99k

80 acres west of Eastland with 2 bedroom, 1 
bath frame home, good grass, beautiful oak 
trees. 2 wells and tanks, good hunting place. 
$70,000.

116 acres east of Cross Plains, 90 acres 
cultivation,several out buildings, stock tank, 
(4) water wells. $186,000

106 acres east of Cross Plains, 90 acres 
cultivation, barn, corrals, .stpek .tank and 
water welL472JM)0.

Cisco N o m o s

3 bedroom, brick home with CTl-CA, new 
carpet, fenced yard, fruit trees and garage. 
Assumable loan.

Nice 3 bedroom, 14it bath brick home in 
good neighborhood. Has (7H/CA, built-ins, 
fireplace, fenced yard, double garage and 
other extras.

A large 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with formal 
dining and breakfast area. Vinyl siding, 
garage, storage building, on 24 lots with 
large oak trees.

Nice 3 bedroom, 1^ bath brick home. Has 
Central heat/air, built-ins, formal dining 
room, double garage on paved street.

2 or 3 bedroom, carpeted home with central 
heat and air. Surrounded by beautiful oak 
trees. Paved street. Also has large shop and 
garage.

Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home. New 
carpet, large rooms. Nice trees and shrub­
bery. Owner financing available.

A 4 bedroom, 14 bath 2 story stone home on 
2 big lots; privacy fence around swimming 
pool. Also has small efficiency rental unit. 
Reducted to $27,900.

Large 2 story with 5 bedrooms, 2 baths, den, 
separate dining and breakfastj||^ms, located 
on 2 big comer lots. Also has nice roomy 
apartment attached. Beautiful landscaped 
yard with lots of trees.

A new 4 bedroom, 2 bath home on .46 acre 
lot, CH-CA, large carport and storage room, 
with fireplace and storm windows.

A 3 bedroom, 1 bath home with a small 
apartment, storage building, situated on 2 
lots. Has central H/A. This nice home has 
been reduced to $26,500.

3 1/)TS with approx. 20 pecan trees. Fenced 
with water well. $10.000.

CommmW
Located near downtown: an older, building 

that would make a good location for a 
business. $35,000.
In Eastland, a new metal building, 2400 sq. ft. 
with dock area. $28,000.

In Ranger, a large 2 story brick building 
with good sized fenced yard. Ixrcated near 
railroad tracks with spur. $85,000.

Valuable 1-20 property. Approx 4,600 sq. ft. 
building, very versatile, easy accessabiiity. 
$77,500.

For commercial use ofdy. 1 to 5 acres with 
1-20 frontage.

Located on Main Street, a 10,000 aq. ft. 
building. Ideal location for a business. Extra 
lots go with this one. $135,000. owner will 
finance with good terms.

PAT MAYNARD 
Brokar 

629-8063

-INDYE FOSTER 
Aoo octati 
629-8195

ANN WILLIAMS 
A m o c Io I »  

442-1880

WAYNE CHANDLER 
Associai» 
734-2782

WE HAVE OTHER H M IE , LAND AND 
COMMERCIAL LILBT1NQ8.

WE APRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS!

K A Y  N O I A N  B U T LER
A s s o c la li A s s o d o t »
629-2365 629-8106

- ■T' ^  ^
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Sunday, Oct. 16, 1983

Fair Say» Thank»
A A )r/]g> euss T>eea _____i ^ ^ { \ A N C e .

Many thanks to each and 
every one who helped make 
the bias'land County Fair a 
hutte success

Special thanks to the bank- 
mg institutions in the coun­
ty; First National Bank, 
Gorman, First State Bank, 
Rising Star; First State 
Bank. Ranger. First Na­
tional Bank, Cisco, Fasiland 
National Bank, Eastland and

Ranger Savings.
Each made a meonetary 

contributions to help us meet 
fair expenses. Thanks.

The Eastland County F air 
Association.

Eastland
M em oria l Hospita l

Ranger
General Hospital

Patients in Ranger General 
Hospital;
Bruce Willis 
Geneva Thurman 
Alla Kuykendall 
Rose Krensavage 
Komona Hem 
Francis Freeman 
Mary Herrington 
Emnutt Wilson 
Inez Owen 
Carrie Cooper

Graham
M em oria l Hospital

in Fl.L. Graham 
were listed as

Patients 
Hospital 
follows:

Ruby Kellar 
Mildred Johnston 
Patricia Otts 
liouise Cassell 
Carla Blakley 
Della MKIarrol 
Barbara Johnston

LaQuinta McKensie 
Elizabeth Harrison 
Rosa M Waller 
Esther Griffith 
Paul Pedigo 
Inar M. Parten 
Reba Armstrong 
Gertrude Mahan 
Prebble I. Chaney 
Kattie Kilgore 
James W Reid 
Lucy Stoker 
11a l.ane 
liCnorah Alford 
Bonnie Dennis 
Sandra Holloway 
Ila Burfeind 
Minnie Bradford 
Donald Nicholas 
Randa J. Bishop 
Joe S. Amerson 
Flonne Miller 
James (J im ) Krantz 
Ronnie maston 
Grady Sproles 
Victor Pittman 
Thomas Reed 
Qemente Z. Rodriquez 
Bill Duncan 
Lorene Ivy 
Pearl Drienhofer 
John (Ted ) Dnenhofer

WANTED:
Qualified, experienced

Mechanics and Body Man 
Apply In person

FuUen Motor Co. ^
Full Benefits

Anterless Deer
Texas Parks and Wildlife 

D epartm en t w ill issue 
antlerless deer permits for 
Eastland County on Oct. 27 
from 8:00 a.m. - 12:00 noon 
and 1:00 - 5:00 p.m. in the 
Eastland Courthouse.

A map with the antlerless

Permits To Be Issued Oct. 27 At Courthouse

Ready Mode 
Blifiid by

LiVOLOR!

23 X 42 - $19.35 
35 X 42 - $23.07 
3« X 50 - $27.49 
35 X 64 • $29.10 
43 X 64 - $34.80 
23 X 72 - $25.11

IN STOCK 33 X 72 - $31.02

■iiisl measure the width and length of your window 
'rallies It's as easy as that. ^

Beil Draperies
170t> Vi i'oriunerce 817-6211-1319 Eastland, TX 76448

Buy a new John Deere 
Tractor or 

Riding Mower 
and make no installments 

till April 1.1984!

' - .l’ i '-q
. \ . A ' 1"»’ •*

• ■ Aj ’ ’ »M4 P

• -,hU v 
M • -1

Nothing R uns Like a Deere
Bram lett Implement Inc.

of Rising Star
Ml: 643-4311 «UHi

l^ssey Studio 

PRESENTS

’S
...A PORTRAIT 

PACKAGE SPECIAL
12 "Great Portraits"

in Living Color  
c

WITH S3.00 Deposit 
W hen Pholographed

* 2 8 1 )0 s 
.  25 I  7s
•  8'Wollets
FREE
C h a rm s with pai kaqe

AM  A C . f S  M l l l M I l

D A T E S

lOct. 17-18
D A Y S

Mon. I  
Tuts.

H O U R S

12 • 7 p.m.|

Best Westam Mottl in Eostlond

deer permit issuance com­
partments and issuance 
rates will be posted in the 
county courthouse prior to 
the issuance date. To qualify 
for permits, a landowner 
must own or control acreage 
equal to at least one-half of

the permit issuance rate of 
the compartment where the 
tract is located.

After opening of the hun­
ting season, permits will on­
ly be available through 
Regional Offices located in 
R ockport, San Angelo ,

Tyler. Waco and the State 
Office in Austin. Permits 
will not be issued by local 
department personnel.

Landow ners or other 
agents are urged to pick up 
permits on the scheduled is­
suance dates.

Proudly Presents • • •

o e

The Kendalls
Soturday, O ct. 15 9 :00 P.M . ■ 1:00 A .M .

T ickets Availoble a t the Door

Spindle Top Steak House
Opens a t 6 :0 0  Com e Early & Enjoy a  M eal

Availoble

THE RIG
4 Miles N. Eastland on Hwy. 69

- i
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ATTEND THE CHURCH OF YOUR CHOICE

0The following firms, recognizing the importance religion 

plays in ou r community, make this church page possible 

___________________  each Sunday.

Kimbrough Funeral 
Home

300 W . 9th 442-1211

Thornton Feed Mill
1200 Conrad  Hilton Ave.

\Apf*Ufm r^

Rev. Cecil Deadman Begins 
Duties At East Cisco Baptist

The Rev. Cecil Deadman 
and family moved to Cisco 
during the last week of 
September. Rev. Deadman 
began his duties as pastor of 
the East Cisco Baptist 
Church on Sunday, October 
2nd. The family moved from 
Follett, Texas where Bro. 
Deadman served the First 
Baptist Church.

Bro. Deadman and his 
wife, Joyce, have three 
ch ild ren , J «m e s , a 
Sophomore a t^ is c o  High 
School, Christin« in the 6th 
grade and Tracy in the 4th. 
The Deadmans met and 
married while attending 
Howard Payne University in 
Brown wood.

Rev. Deadman is a native 
of Oklahoma. He attended 
public school in Mangum, 
Okla. and graduated from 
Mangum High School in 1965. 
He has attended Howard 
Payne University and Okla. 
City Southwestern Jr. Col­
lege. He has done aditional 
work through the Seminary 
Extension Department of the 
Southern B aptist

Seminaries. Rev. Deadman 
is currently enrolled as an 
extension student through 
T r in ity  T h eo log ica l 
seminary.

Prior to moving to Cisco, 
Bro. Deadman served chur­
ches in Okla. C ity ; 
Frederick, Oklahoma; Com­
anche, Texas; Del City, 
Okla; and most recently 
Follett, Texas. He has been 
actively involved in Associa- 
tional leadership positions, 
servirig as Modfratof, ^ 4 .  
Clerk for the lillm en Baptist 
Association in Okla. and as 
Moderator for the Comanche 
B aptist A ssocia tion  in 
Texas. He has served as a 
member of the Area commit­
tee for the “ Heart of Texas 
Area”  and the “ Top 0 ’ 
Texas Area” .

Active in encampment 
work Bro. Deadman served 
on the Board of Directors for 
Southwest Baptist Assembly 
near Altus, Okla. Heart of 
Texas Baptist Encampment 
at Brown wood, Pan Fork 
Baptist Encampment at 
Wellington, Texas. Bro. 
Deadman also served on the

Program Committee for the 
Oklahoma Baptist Childrens 
Camp held at Falls Creek 
Baptist Assembly and serv­
ed as Director of Recreation 
for two years for the Okla. 
Baptist Childrens camp. 
Rev. Deadman served as 
Camp P a s to r fo r  the 
Southwest Oklahoma Royal 
Ambassador Camp and as 
Camp Pastor for Boys Camp 
at Pan Fork Baptist En­
campment this past sum­
mer, ____  __ ____

Rev. 5ieadman has also 
served as a consultant in the 
area of Lay Ministries with 
the B rotherhood and 
Evangelism Divisions of the 
Baptist General Convention 
of Oklahoma. He has served 
as a leader of conferences 
for the “ ABC’s of Church Ad­
ministration”  for the Church 
Administration Division of 
the Baptist Sunday School 
Board.

The Deadmans were ac­
tive in school and communi­
ty activités while in Follett 
and look forward to becom­
ing an active part of the 
Cisco community.

You Can Erect Your Own 24’x24’x8’ Tall Building with EASTCO’S “ Do 
It Yourself”  Building Kit. Not Just Pre-Cut Lumber, But Assembled 
Walls & Roof Trusses Ready To Erect On Your Foundation. Add Your 
Own Doors & You’ve Got The Garage Or Storage Building You Thought I You Couldn’t Afford.

Included:
8’ Tall Framed Walls of 2x4’s 24”  O.C.
Roof Trusses of 2x4’s 24”  O.C.
Rough X 90 7/16”  Siding, 8”  Groove & Primed 
I 2 ”  CDX Roof Decking 
White Star Composition Fiberglass Shingles 
7’xl6’ Garage Door Opening

Total Price $2,388.00 
Tax Included

Icomplete Plans Are Included Also and Expert Advice is Just a Phone 
ICall Away.
[Free Delivery Within 30 Miles of Our Cisco Plant.
I Call or Come By Today.

EASTCO Homes Inc.
‘ ‘Quality At A Reasonable Cost”

301 East 8th St.
Cisco, Texas p-84

442-4647 or 442-3430 after 5

HfMMNMiniillllllllliailllllllllllDmilllimiOIIHIlWHIiaillHIIIHIlQllHIIIIIII

K  & E Motor And Garage
707 Ave. F. Cisco

All K ind O f  Mechanic W ork.

Exchange Motors &  Transmissions.

Oil Changes & Tune Ups.

Open 8 To 5 Mon. thru Sat.

442-4053 442-1807 Nights
HQMMMNcaNssnsiKMnsssNmNNNSNiassssssoisssnsiaasssNiiaNsiisi

REDEEM ER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Sunday School and Bible 
Classes begin at 9:30 a.m. 
Worsliip Service begins at 
10:30 a.m. Pastor Petersen’s 
message is entitled “ Are We 
L ike One o f The Ten 
Lepers?”  based on Luke 
17:11-19. Are you in charge of 
your life? “ A lot of people 
plan to achieve satisfaction 
in life solely through their 
own e ffo r ts ,”  says Dr. 
Oswald Hoffmann, Lutheran 
Hour speaker. “ They will 
make it on their own and 
make a lot of money to boot, 
n ever recogn iz in g  how 
poverty-stricken their lives 
really are. It is hard to

Senior Citizens 
Nutrition Meni

Christm as is com ing, 
sooner than you think! 
Therefore, while our thought 
for today does not concern 
nutrition, it certainly con­
cerns all of us who plan to 
buy toys for children.

Picking a Christmas gift 
for your grandchild may not 
be a simple job. There are 
many items on the market, 
and who wants to spend 
money on a toy the child 
might be bored with after a 
short tim e! I t ’ s up to 
you...the thoughful buyer, to 
know which toys offer the 
best value in dollars and 
sense.

But you might ask yourst 
these questions: Is it geared 
to the child’s age group? Will 
it foster creativity? Does it 
contribute to the learning 
process? And last but not 
least, will it grow with the 
chUd?

The programs for the past 
week included: Larry Coats, 
James Cotton & Linda Berry 
singing several songs; The 
Rising Star Band; and game 
day in Eastland for both 
Cisco and Eastland senior 
citizens groups.

The menus for the coming
w p p Ic w ill I v

MONDAY:Baked chicken, 
carrot-raisin salad with 
mayonnaise, beans, orange 
whip, bread, butter and 
drink.

W EDNESDAY: Vegetable 
beef stew, raw vegetable 
salad with Cheddar cheese, 
banana pudding, combread, 
butter and drink.

F R ID A Y :B ra ised  beef, 
brown gravy with noodles, 
yellow squash, creamy cab­
bage slaw, simple simón 
bar, bread, butter and drink.

I Q I  b irth s . . . . . . . 1
LATISHA LEANN RUCKER

Kimberly Nicole Stovall of 
Cisco is proud to announce 
the birth of her cousin, 
Latisha Leann Rucker. 
Latisha m ade her ap­
pearance into this world on 
October 6th at 7:32 p.m. She 
weighed in at 8 lbs. 4  oz. and 
was 19̂ 4 inches in length. 
The happy parents are Rick 
and M arg ie  Rucker of 
Hawley. Paternal grand­
parents (for the first time) 
are Bill and Frances Rucker 
of Hawley. Maternal grand­
parents are Fred and Margie 
Stovall of Moran. Paternal 
great-grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Davis of 
Cross P la ins. M aternal 
great-grandparents are Em­
ma Powell of Harbeson, 
D elaware and Fred G. 
Stovall Sr. of Moran. Latisha 
also has two great-great­
grandm others on her 
mothers side, Eva Powell of 
Powellville, Maryland and 
Matilda Foskey of Salisbury, 
Maryland.

The Q fco  Press
Sunday,

October 16, 1983

remember; We may make 
plans, but God always has 
the last word.”  Be sure to 
hear the message “ Plan B” 
on The Lutheran Hour, Sun­
day at 12:30 p.m. over radio 
station KEAS in Eastland.

Tuesday, the Luke (9:10ff) 
Bible Study will meet in the 
Parish Hall at 9:30 a.m. 
Catechism will be at 3:45 
p.m. in the Parish Hall and 
the Choir will meet at 7:30 
p.m.

Wednesday, The Cisco 
Care Center worship will be 
at 10:00 a.m. Thursday, 
Jesus Friends will meet in 
the Parish Hall at 9:30 a.m. 
and 2:45 p.m. Be sure to 
remember The Big Country 
Lutheran Reformation Rally 
will be held on Sunday, 
November 6, 19*3, at the 
Abilene Civic Center, 3:00 
p.m. - 4:30 p.m.

SlVi .THAfcllS

Qnndi Mroctmy
CALVARY 

BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Ronnie Shackelford 

Pastor
18th and Ave. D

Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7;M p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
7:30 p.m.

FIRST UNITED 
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 

307 W. 17th St.
Rev. Stephen F. Wheeler

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 7:00 p.m. 
Tuesday-Bible Study 7:30 
p.m.
Friday-Youth Service 7:30

. p m .

GREATER ST. MARK 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. J.C. Mills, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Service 
7:00 p.m.

CHURCH OF 
THE NAZARENE 
W. 10th and Ave. N 

Rev. C.L. Reneau, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
7:30 p.m.

FIRST EVANGELICAL 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. John W. Clinton, Pastor 
Highway 80 West 

Across From Hospital 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Hour of Power in 
Prayer 7:30 p.m.

CISCO CHURCH 
OF CHRIST 

Jim Hatcher, Minister 
1-20 North Access Road at 

Ave. N
Sunday Bible (Hasses 9:30 
a.m.
Worship Service 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Services 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday, Mid-Week Ser- 

. vice 7:30 p.m.
Ladies 10:00 a.m. Tuesday

M IT C H E L L  B A P T IS T  
CHURCH

Joe Philpott, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Preaching 10:45 a.m.
Sunday Night 7:00 p.m. 
Prayer Service Wednesday 
8:00 p.m.

FAITH  BAPTIST CHURCH 
700 West 18th 

J. Doyle Roberts, Pastor 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening Wor­
ship 7:30 p.m.

G R E A T E R  M O U N T A IN  
TO P  U N IT E D  PE N E T- 

COSTAL CHURCH 
Hwy. 183, 12 miles South of 

Cisco
P.O. Box 2(9 Cisco, Texas 

Pastor John C. Jones 
Phone 043-3(29 Sunday 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evangelistic Services 7:00 
p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 
p.m.

REVIVAL TABERNACLE 
Attention

Special Announcement 
Sunday at 1 p.m. on KERC 
Radio, Special preaching, 
annointed singing. 
Deliverance for both soul 
and body all in the name of 
Jesus! Special prayer for the 
sick!

FOURTH STREET 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Sunday 10:30 a.m.
Evening 5:00 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Buddy Sipe 

Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
(Hiurch Training 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
W ednesday; M id-W eek 
Prayer Meeting 7:00 p.m.

EAST CISCO 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Cecil Deadman 

506 E. nth
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Training Union 5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m. 
M id-W eek  S e rv ic e s ; 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

IN S P IR A T IO N  CHURCH 
OF GOD

Rev. Larry Smith 
Camp Inspiration-Box 167 

Eastland, Texas 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Service 7:00 
p.m.

P R IM IT IV E  B A P T IS T  
CHURCH

James E. Robertson Jr., 
Minister

Services 2nd Sunday each 
month
Singing 10:30 a.m.
Preaching 11:00 a.m.

FIRST CHRISTIAN 
CHURCH

Milo Steffea, Minister
CHmrch School 9:40 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Bible Studv 6:30 p.m.

C O R IN T H  B A P T IS T  
CHURCH

Cisco-Eastbind Highway 
Rev. Burditt Hitt, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Training Union 5:30 
p.m.
Sunday Evening Service 6; 30 
p.m.
Wednesday Night 6:30 p.m.

CATHOLIC CHURCHES 
Rev. James Miller

St. Francis, Eastland, 6:30 
p.m. Saturday.
St. Rita, Ranger, 9:45 a.m. 
Sunday
St. John Strawn, 8:00 a.m., 
Sunday
Holy Rosary, Cisco, 11:30 
a.m. Sunday

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. Frank Williams, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship Service 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
U.M. Women Tuesday 9:30 
a.m.

F IR ST P R E S B Y T E R IA N  
CHURCH 

500 W. 6th St.
Rev. W illiam  C. Weeks 

Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m.

CHURCH OF GOD 
Seventh Day 

Romney Community 
South of Cisco

Worship: 11:00 a.m. Satur­
day
Telephone 442-3962

CHURCH OF JESUS 
CHRIST OF LATTER DAY 

SAINTS
Opening Exercises 9:30 a.m. 
Primary 9:30-11:10 a.m. 
Priesthood 9:30-10:20 a.m. 
Relief Society 9:30-10:20
a.m.
Sunday School 10:30-11:10 
a.m.
Sacram en t S e rv ic e : 
11:20-12:30

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Fundamental 

Ave. E. at 17th St.
Rev. Larry Sowels
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Worship Service 
7:30 p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF YAHWEH 
(7th day)

Worship - 11:00 a.m. Satur­
day
Welcome! Only ten minutes 
south of Cisco on U.S. 
Highway 183

WORD OF U F E  FAITH 
CENTER

Comer of East 7th A  Ave. A
Sunday Morning 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evening 7:00 p.m. 
Thursday Evening 7:00 p.m.

LONG BRANCH BAPTIST 
CHURCH

John Hagan, Pastor 
11 M iles  S. of C isco 

183-FoIlow Signs
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evening 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF (H)D
307 W. 7th S t 
Phone 442-15(1

Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11;9( a.m. 
Evening Worship (:M  p.m. 
Wednesday Bible Study 7 ;00 
p.m.

M A R A N A T H A  B A P T IS T  
CHURCH 

Independent 
Fundraental 

Pastor M.H. Jones 
Highway 80 West of Eastland 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Prayer Services 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Services 7:30 
p.m.

W ESLEY UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. Frank Williams, Pastor 
Ave. A

Morning Worship 9.00 a.m. 
(?hurch School 10:00 a.m. 
F'amily Night 4th Thursday 
each month.
A d m in is tra t iv e  Board 
Meeting: 1st Monday Night 
Elach Month.

THE LANDMARK 
APOSTOLIC 

409 W. 11th street 
Rev. Jay Williams, Pastor

Thursday Night 7:30 p.m. 
Saturday Night Youth Ser­
vice 7:30 p.m.
Sunday Mornk^ at 10:00 
a.m.
Sunday Night at 7:00 p.m. 
442-4177

HOLY TR IN ITY  
EPISCOPAL CHURCH 

S. Seaman 
Elastland, Texas 

The Rev. John A. Holmes 
Holy Communion 11:00 a.m.

PLEASANT HILL BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Pleasaut Hill Community 
8 miles South of Cisco 
A.G. Purvis, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 5:30 p.m.

REDEEM ER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Rev. Dell J. Crockett, Pastor 
Ave. D and East 18th

Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Worship Service 10:30 a.m.

F A IT H  C H A PE L  F U L L  
GOSPEL CHURCH

308 West 11th 
Rev. James Harris

9:45 a.m. Sunday 
7:00 p.m. Sunday 
7:30 p.m. Wednesday

GOSPEL ASSEMBUr 
M N Ave. A. and East 10th 

Carl Begley-Mlalster 
Bible Teaching Subject To 
Question And Children’s 
Church Sunday 2:30 p jn . 
Worship Service Thursday h  
Saturday 7:30 p.m.
Special Music k  Singing All 
Services

*



AN EXTRA COLD winter 
ie in proepect. We received 
this report frwn Mrs. Bobby 
Ingram, police department 
girl Friday, and she got the 
information from her dad, 
Mr. Jewell Snider, of Gor­
man.

M r. Snider has been 
around long enough to read 
the signs such as the extra 
heavy coat o f hair on 
aninuds, food storage habita 
of squirrels and the Uke. 
So...you’d better get your 
long handles ready.

The weather man’s first 
norther of the fall blew in 
Tu esd ay n igh t and 
temperatures were in the 
low 50’s early Wednesday 
and upper 40’s early Thurs­
day. Folks were out in coats 
and sweaters and Dr. E.E. 
Addy came out in his beret.

WHEN YOU GO out of 
town for a month, there are 
things you miss that you 
would i^ ve  wanted to at­
tend...Things like the party 
they gave at the First Na­
tional Bank’s community 
room recently for Mrs. E.E. 
Addy, Sr., on her 9Sth birth­
day.

Many friends and ad­
mirers of Gran Addy drop­
ped in to pay their respects 
and to wish her a happy, hap­
py birthday. Our scouts 
report that she thoroughly 
en joyed  the event and 
greeted one and all with a 
good word and a big smile.

Those of us who missed the 
happy occasion want to 
haken to add our best wishes 
for many more good years.

THERE’S A NEW house 
under construction on West 
14th Street in the Oaks Addi­
tion, and it’s being built by 
Contractor Hollis Williams 
of Cisco for Jim and Sylvia 
George of Cisco. It's a three 
bedroom, two bath brick 
home and will have central 
heat and au* and a lot of 
features.

The Georges recently sold 
their home at 1109 West 7th 
Street to Mrs. Dorothy 
Oakley of Hico, mother of 
Mrs. Gilbert Copeland of 
Cisco. The new George house 
is expected to be finished in 
about a month.

Mr. George is employed as 
safety director for EnRe Oil 
Corporation here.

Y O U ’ V E  P R O B A B L Y  
already noticed it but the big 
Ixibo Band board in the win­
dow at The Lemon Tree is 
very nice. It contains pic­
tures o f band 
members...And the African 
Violets in the window at 
Dean Drug are worth a se­
cond and maybe a third 
glance...Wayne Webb, local 
contractor, has purchased 
the Hanlon home at the cor­
ner of West 14th St. and 
Avenue N, according to 
scout reports...Glad to hear 
that Mrs. Brad (Sharon) 
Wilcoxen is doing nicely

O J o b it ija r iB S..I
Services For 

Sybil Jo Myers 

Held Monday
Sybil Jo Myers, 59, of 2401 

Pine St., a former Cisco 
Junior (College instructor, 
died at 8:34 p.m. Monday at 
Hendrick Medical Onter. 
Services were at 2 p.m. 
Wednesday at Elliott-Hamil 
Funeral Home, 542 Hickory 
St. in Abilene.

The Rev. Pepper Puryear 
officiated. Burial was at 
Pleasant HUl O m etery near 
Cisco.

Bom March 1, 1924, in 
Loraine, she graduated from 
Foursan High School. She 
married Bill Myers Sept. 17, 
1948, in Abilene. She manag­
ed a Burger King for two 
years, and she also worked 
for 12 years as an insturctor 
at Cisco Junior College. She 
had lived in C ^ o  for 12 
years, moving to Abilene 
from B row nw (^  in 1963. She 
was a member of First Bap­
tist Church in Ciaco.

Survivors include her hus­
band; two sons, Billy Lee 
Myers Jr. of Austin and Jim­
my Myers of Fort Worth; a 
daughter, V idd Jo Palmer of 
Abilene; her father, Marvin 
Claxton of Abilene; two 
sisters, Alta Bart of Irving 
and Jeannie Claxton of 
D a llas ; three brothers, 
Lloyd Claxton of Big Spring, 
J.L. Claxton of Houston and 
Burl Claxton of Detroit, 
Mich.; a courin, Norman 
McMahan of Colorado O ty; 
three grandchildren; aiid 
several nieces and pephews.

following surgery for a sinus 
problem . H ospitalization 
wasn’t required.

WHEN YOU GO out of 
town for a month, there are 
things you miss that you 
would have wanted to at­
tend...Things like the party 
they gave at, the First Na­
tional Bank’s community 
room recently for Mrs. E.E. 
Addy, Sr., on her 98th birth­
day.

Many friends and ad­
mirers of Gran Addy drop­
ped in to pay their respects 
and to wish her a happy, hap­
py birthday. Our scouts 
report that she thoroughly 
en joyed the event and 
greeted one and all with a 
good word and a big smile.

Those of us who missed the 
happy occasion want to 
hasten to add our best wishe.s 
for nuny more good years.

THERE’S A NEW house 
under construction on West 
14th Street in the Oaks Addi­
tion, and it’s being built by 
(Contractor Hollis Williams 
of Cisco for Jim and Sylvia 
George of Cisco. It's a three 

« bedroom, two bath brick 
home and will have central 
heat and air and a lot of 
features.

The Georges recently sold 
their home at 1109 West 7th 
Street to Mrs. Dorothy 
Oakley of Hico, mother of 
Mrs. Gilbert Copeland of 
Cisco. The new George house 
is expected to be finished in 
about a month.

Mr. George is employed as 
safety director for EnRe Oil 
Corporation here.

Y O U ’ V E  P R O B A B L Y  
already noticed it but the big 
Lobo Band board in the win­
dow at The Lemon Tree is 
very nice. It contains pic­
tures o f band 
members...And the African 
Violets in the window at 
Dean Drug are worth a se­
cond and maybe a third 
glance...Wayne Webb, local 
contractor, has purchased 
the Hanlon home at the cor­
ner of West 14th St. and 
Avenue N, according to 
scout reports...Glad to hear 
that Mrs. Brad (Sharon) 
Wilcoxen is doing nicely 
following surgery for a sinus 
problem . Hospitalization 
wasn’t required.

THE JOHN McGuires

postcarded friends from 
O regon  last w eekend. 
They’re spending a couple of 
months vacationing in the 
northwest and Canadian 
Rockies and were due at the 
home of their daugher. Miss 
C h a rlo tte  M cG u ire , in 
T e llu r id e , C o lo ., this 
weekend... Mrs. J.C. Flet­
cher is back home after 
spending several days in the 
E .L . G raham  M em orial 
Hospital... The annual mini­
marathon was a good suc­
cess out at City Park last 
Tuesday afternoon. Guess 
they’ll turn in a list of the 
w in n ers ... M r. M elv in  
W ende, the assistan t 
postmaster, is sporting a 
beard that’s now six weeks 
old. Understand he’s grow­
ing it for the upcoming deer 
hunting season in Colorado.

TOTAL RESOURCES of 
the First National Bank 
were up nearly $500,000 at 
the end of the third quarter 
as compared with figures for 
three months earlier. And 
this indicates a healthy con­
dition for our community... 
Mr. Ronnie Ledbetter, local 
insurance man, recently en­
joyed a white wing dove hunt 
in the Sugar Lake country of 
Mexico. He made the trip 
with a group of Dallas 
friends and shooting was 
super, he reports . He 
brought home 60 birds-all 
the law allows...Thieves 
struck at the Cisco golf 
course last Saturday night. 
They made off with seven 
green cup flags. And a few 
nights before some vandal 
drove a car across the No. 5 
green with considerable 
damage. They’re rebuilding 
the No. 9 green as it had been 
in trouble for several mon­
ths.

TH E  H O N O R A B LE  
Jasper Cooks, judge of the

people’s court in our town, 
will fUl the pulpit at First 
Methodist Church Sunday 
morning. It is Layman’s 
Day. Judge Cook, by the 
way, was the speaker for a 
dinner meeting of the Lions 
Club in Hillsboro the other 
night... Mrs. Helen Orr, ad­
ministrator of E.L. Graham 
Memorial Hospital, was in 
Boston, Mass., last week to 
attend a convention of the 
American Medical Techni­
cians Association... The 
W inston H eidenheim ers 
went with a group of friends 
from the Abilene area to 
New York (Tity last week for 
a few days of sight seeing 
and attending theater pro­
grams.

M ISS M A R G A R E T  
Hallmark of Eastland (boun­
ty Newspapers staff is the 
proud owner of a brand new 
Ford Bronco II. She hasn’t 
decided on a policy for loan­
ing it yet, she advises us... 
You can buy tickets for the 
cu e Ranger JC Lions benefit 
bowl football game at The 
Press office or from any 
local lion. Let’s all plan to at­
tend the October 21st event.

Cisco Care 

Center Council 
Will Meet Mon.

The Volunteer Council of 
Cisco (^ re  Center will meet 
Monday, October 17, at 7:00 
p.m. in the dining room at 
Cisco Care Center. Mae 
Green activity director, in­
vites all persons interested 
in planning and supporting 
for the residents to attend 
this quartely meeting.

KPMT (M. HELD TMIVES 
1-800-OIL-COPS 

TOLL FHEf • REWARD

jty Drug t;o.
Side Walk Specials

ligvioii Noil Polish ••••••• R
i IfdaoL Factor Shadow Com pocts...................

Revlon Eyeshodows.....................
$ 0 0 0  Mch

^  (3 colort)̂

25%
I  ̂Cosniotic B o o s.....................
i 1
I  ̂ Boby Items Reduced........
II Lorge Selection of Gift Items for
11 Eorly Dlscount-Chrlstmos Shopping
t i Toiletries Reduced Housewore Items Closeoul 

rion Velcro Wollets Reduced
Petite to Med. Ultra Sense Ponty Hose

Cisco

Come In & Browse & Plon on Trying some of
Scooter's frozen Yogurt 

reoturing 4 of Your fovoiite Flovors 
800 Conrud Hilton Aw. 442-2587

Restouront
600 E u t8 th  Open 7 Doyi A Week

THIS WEEK'S SPECIAL
Breokfost: 1 Egg, Hath Browne, Toott,

Coffee Or Tea M.25 
2 Eggs, Hash Browns, Toost,

Coffee Or Ten M .50
Chin l  Eggs Spedol 

T o ast, Coffee
Po^on ^ .7 5  (For Everyone) 

Senior Citizens ^3.00 
Regular ^3.25 

Lunches Every Day
We Have Fresh Made Donuts And Day Old Donuts

New CofC Members
■V.

LITTLE  SHOES, 205 E. 8th Street, Cisco was 
being welcomed Wednesday morning as a new 
member of the Cisco Chamber of Commerce 
when the above photograph was made. The new 
shop will specialize in offering children’ s shoes 
and socks. It is open from 9 a.m. to 5 p.m., Mon­
day thru Thursday and Saturdays, oin Fridays, 
it is open from 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. They may be

reached at 442-4511. Shown at the ceremony 
were (left to right) Randy Speegle, CofC 
manager; Fred Wheeler, CofC membership 
committee; Nancy Bacon and Dela Sedillo, 
owners of the shop. Shirley Hargrave, CofC 
membership committee, and Roy Dennis, CofC 
membership committee are shown in the back 
row. (staff photo)

THE LOBO and J.R.’s, 709 Conrad Hilton 
Avenue, Cisco, was being welcomed as a new 
member of Cisco’s Chamber of Commerce 
when the above photograph was taken Wednes­
day morning. The Lobo and J.R.’s is a family 
hair care center. They are open Tuesday thru 
Saturday and appointments may be made at 
442-9979 or 442-3551. Shown during the welcom­
ing ceremony are (front row, left to right):

Mark Dobson, Lobo em ployee; Shirley 
Hargrave, CofC membership committee; Jim 
and Lesa Roberts, owners; and Fred Wheeler, 
CofC membership committee. Shown in the 
back row are (left to right): Roy Dennis, CofC 
membership committee; Charlene Thomas, 
J.R.’ s employee; Stephanie Proffitt, J.R.’s 
employee; Emd Randy Speegle, CofC manager, 
(staff photo)

V

‘M e c E a n i c H
MIASl CERTIFIED MECHANIC ON DUTY

IM TRO D U Cm .........HOWARD WHITE,
staff Mechanic at Walton Electric Co. 

Howard Is Certified by the
NATIONAL INSTITUTS FOR AUTOMOTIVE 
SERVICE EXCELLENCE.

He is Highly Skilled in all phases o 
Auto Repoir & is looking forword to 
Serving You.

Bring Your Vehicle in Today 
for 0 Tune-Up, Oil & Lube,
Exhaust Work, or Brake Job.
Let Us Winterize Your Vehicle!
Now for the Winter months 
just ahead.

CUSTOM HYDRAULIC 
MUFFLER SHOP HOSE & FIH IN GS
(Complett Exfioust

FULTRON ELECTRONICS 
Radios, Speakers, etc.

OIL A LUBE (Coming Soon)

f u l l  s e r v ic e  g a s
Mott vehicles STATION '

BRAKE W ORK, *“ ">
Rotors A Drums 

Turned 
Each

Compare Our Prices A Sovi

lAi ask c* WALTON ELECTRIC AUTO PARTS ^
n ,  vtn St. foy Qy0f 40 Yeqi^ 442-2366


