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IF YOU HURRY, you 
might still be able to make 
some of the Retail Trade 
Day sales in Cisco since this 
paper is delivered on Satur­
day (instead of Sunday, as 
the dateline says.) Cisco 
merchants were busy Satur­
day with sidewalk sales be­
ing held for the Chamber of 
Commerce sponsored Retail 
Trade Day.

The day was being spon­
sored by the CofC’s Retail 
Trade Committee.

One of the highlights was 
to be the “ Little Mr. Cisco”  
contest at 2 p.m. in front of 
the First National Bank 
building.

A good number of persons 
were expected to attend, 
especia lly  since adver­
tisements were printed in 
Thursday's editions of The 
C isco P ress, Eastland 
Telegram, Hanger Times 
and The Rising Star, as well 
as area radio stations broad­
casting about the event.

F(K)TBALL FANS who 
are interested in helping to 
show their support to this 
year’s football teams in 
Cisco are urged to contact 
the Press office before 10 
a m. Tuesday morning, 
August 30. We are in the pro­
cess of composing our an­
nual f(M)tball page which will 
be printed in every Thurs­
day’s edition of the Press 
during the season.

Show your support of the 
local teams and place your 
business name on this page.

If you arc not contacted 
about the page, be sure and 
call our office before 10 
Tuesday. I.et’s all help back 
our liK-al teams to champion­
ship ranks this year.

A GOOD GROUP of 
citizens turned out here Fri­
day night to listen to The 
Glory-Heirs, a gospel sing­
ing group from Abilene. The 
open-air concert was held

underneath the pavillion in 
Cisco City Park.

The Glory-Heirs are a very 
talented and God-loving 
group who have performed 
numerous times in local 
churches. They also per­
formed at the past Folk-Life 
Festival held in Cisco.

If you haven’t already, ex­
press your thanks to the 
Cisco Minsterial Association 
lor helping to arrange for 
such good entertainment, 
which also is a ministry to 
the Lord.

25‘ The Cisco Press
'Your Hometown Paper'

19B3--Eottlond County Nawtpopar Co Cisco Tenos 76437

Volume 75 Number 69 Sunday, August 28, 1983 USPS No. 113780

e je  Outlook Is Good For Large Enrollment
The outlook is good for a 

large enrollment as the 
19ft3-84 school year begins 
during the coming week at 
Cisco Junior College, Dr. 
Norman Wallace, president, 
reported Friday.

Dormitories will open at 2 
p.m. Sunday, August 28, as 
students begin arriving, and 
the cafeteria will open at 7 
a m. Monday. The program 
for the week calls for 
freshman orientation in the 
Fine Arts Building 
auditorium at 9 a.m. Mon­
day.

The faculty, which held a 
general meeting at 10 a.m. 
Friday to discuss the coming 
year’s program, will be 
available for help in schedul­
ing and advising on Tuesday, 
and registration will begin at 
the Student Union Building 
at 9 a.m. Wednesday, August 
31. Registration will be from 
9 a m. to 4 p.m. and from 6 to 
8 p.m.

Registration will continue 
Thursday, September 1, en­
ding at 4 p.m. There will be a 
hamburger cookout and in­
formal dance at the SUB 
Thursday night. Friday, 
September 2, will be the first 
class day with freshman 
orientation scheduled from

10 to 11 am .
The football team, which 

began workouts August 14th, 
will go to Abilene to play the 
McMurry JV at 7:30 p.m. 
Saturday, Augusts. Monday, 
August 5, will be a holiday.

Registration took place at 
the Clyde and Abilene 
centers August 23 and 24. 
Late registration will con­
tinue through September 
15th.

Dr. Wallace said that pre- 
registration and other in­
dications point to a large stu­
dent body for the fall 
semester. He said that 
everything was in readiness 
for the new school year.

A list of college ad­
ministrators, instructors 
and employees was released 
as follows; Dr. Wallace, 
president; Carroll Scott, 
vice president; Ralph Glenn, 
dean of financial affairs; 
Clois Purvis, academ ic 
dean ; G erald  Bint, 
vocational-technical dean; 
David Allen, director of 
Abilene programs; John 
Muller, dean of student life; 
Olin Odom, registrar; and 
Em m a W atts, ad ­
ministrative assistant.

Central offices: Abilene 
center, Frances McKinnon,

busar; Carolyn Welcome, 
counselor; and Betty Alford, 
LVN. Bookstore: Jerry 
Toland; business office, 
Carlene Conner, Frances 
Frailey and Jackie Hen­
dricks; ca feteria , John 
Rehak; Clyde center, Colene 
Byrom; counselor, RoseSar- 
zoza; dean’s office, Loretta 
Donham; Electronic Data 
Processing, Herman Dunlap 
and Elvie Williams; finan­
cial aid, Sheila Walton.

Library, Oleta Shirley, 
Quida Gorr, Janet Heyser 
and Joy In gram ; 
maintenance, Jay Maples, 
supervisor, Harold Steddum, 
Ralph Proctor, Christine 
Chriesman, Jerry Bailey, 
Charles Cox, John Smith, 
Hershell McDonald, Fred 
Anderson, John Trimble, 
Jenny V. Parker, Rueben 
T olentino and Shorty 
Callaway.

Print shop; Betty Hogan 
and Sheila Dunlap; public in- 
form a tion , C harlotte 
Speegle; registrar’s office, 
Melba Brawley and Linda 
Roberson; senior citizens, 
Ruth Cartee; snack bar, 
TomSmartt; student advise­
ment center, Robbie Robin­
son; student life, Shirley 
Smothers; student govern­

ment, Shirley Smothers; 
switchboard, Pat Dill; and 
verteran’s office LaVeme 
Andrews.

Faculty members were 
listed as follow s: Gary 
Adams, Bible and business; 
Bobby Anderson, PE; Glen- 
nis Boyd, office occupations; 
Carl Bray, physics; Anna 
B ra ze ll, photography ; 
George Brazell, psychology 
and s o c io lo g y ; Donna 
Burleson, LVN; Danny 
Qaborn, auto mechanics.

D essie C ovington ,

cosmetology; Philip Craik, 
drama; Darlene Donham, 
data processing, Lottie Far­
ris, LVN; Linda Gates, 
LVN; Bob Gates, elect; Her­
man Glueck, agriculture; 
Joe Dell Gregory, MaMe; 
Peggy Grunes, CCD; Ken­
neth Hammes, English.

N ancy H am m es,
developm ental studies; 
Becky Hardman, LVN; 
Nicki Harle, PE; Ronnie 
Heame, PE; Gary Hill, law 
enforcement; Rose Mary

Hill, LVN; Kay Jackson, 
auto mechanics; Terrell 
Jackson, w elding; Tim 
Jones, band; Ruth Julien, 
LVN; Bob Keyes, PE; 
Michael Lauch, govern­
ment; Monty Lewis, history; 
Johnnie McDaniel, math.

Dan Montgomery, PE; 
Katherine Muller, math; 
Fred Mullinax, speech; Sue 
Mulltnax, art; Josefina 
Naredo, Spanish; Dorothy 
Newman, HS; Carolyn Page, 
business; Marvin Payne, 
chemistry; Wyley Peebles,

music; Tommie Pope, draf­
ting; Harold Prescott, PE; 
Cleatus Rattan, English; 
Connie Rattan, English; 
Robert Robinson, biology; 
Susie Shahan, CCD; Oleta 
Shirley, librarian; Clay 
Spam , MaMe; R ichard 
Spincer, government.

Wesley Valek, history and 
government, Ted Weaver, 
MM, Wanda W heatley, 
LVN ; Jim  W indham , 
biology; Cert Winter, elect; 
and Steven Zell, music.

Last Jurors To Be Picked; 
Testimony Due Next Week

State Officials Will File 
Suit Against City Of Cisco

state officials discussed 
details of a suit to force com­
pliance with waste water 
regulations that will be filed 
next week in 91st District 
Court at a meeting with City 
of Cisco authorities at City 
Hall here last Tuesday after­
noon.

Purpose of the meeting 
was for state officials to go 
into details of the litigation 
and for city officials to ex­
plain their position and ef­
forts to remedy the problem, 
according to City Manager 
Mike Moore.

Attending the conference 
were Nancy Lynch of Austin, 
assistant Texas Attorney 
General, Environmental 
Protection Division; Rod 
Bolton of Austin, Enforce­
ment Division of the Texas 
D epartm ent of W ater 
Resources; Wilson Snyder of 
Waco. Texas Departrnent of 
Water Resources; Eris Rit­
chie. mayor of Cisco; Brad 
Kimbrough and Bobby In­
gram, city councilmen; Billy 
Wright, city attorney; Bill 
Jacob, city engineer; and 
the city manager

The city was informed that 
the court suit will allege that 
Cisco has violated state 
waste water disposal regula­
tions at the sewage disposal 
plant a total of 120 times 
since 1976, Mr. Moore said. 
The city was also informed 
that the state would seek 
civil damages that could run 
as high as $1,000 per day.

Mayor Ritchie and other 
Cisco officials, including 
Engineer Jacob, told the 
state authorities that plans 
are in the final stages for a 
new sewage disposal plant to 
serve the community. They 
went into details of the pro­
ject.

State officials noted that 
Cisco city councils had been 
warned of their plant’s pro­
blems for many years and 
that action had been promis­
ed from time to time without 
results. It was indicated that 
the state expects a time­
table for compliance with 
regulations in addition to 
civil damages.

"We assured the state that 
we have come up with the 
most cost effective plan and 
system for a new waste 
water disposal plant,”  Mr. 
Moore said. "We also gave 
assurance that we have been 
and are working hard to br­
ing our disposal plant into 
compliance with all regula­
tions.”

The c i t y ’ s plans for 
answering court action were 
discussed at an executive

session of City Council after 
the regular semi-monthly 
meeting Tuesday night.

‘ ‘This is a very serious 
matter and dealing with it 
can no longer be postponed,”  
Mayor Ritchie said.

State officials said the ci­
ty’s present sewage disposal 
plant is of the type that no 
longer would be approved. It 
has been in use for more 
than 50 years and is too 
small to meet the demand 
placed on it.

Mr. Moore said the at­
torney general had filed suit 
against a number of Texas 
cities in similar situations in 
the past few years and that 
civil damages have been 
awarded in most cases.

Attorney Lynch told inter­
viewers in Austin Wednes­
day that "the suit is going to

be filed, but once it’s filed 
there is a strong possibility 
we will be able to work out 
an agreed resolution.”

The city spent $175,000 last 
fall for a new sewer out-fall 
line that has relieved the 
amount of fluid that goes to 
collection lines. The city’s 
plans for a $1,500,000 im­
provement program for the 
water system is now being 
finalized.

A new sewer plant is the 
third phase of a bond issue 
approved by Cisco voters 
last year, and steps have 
been taken for a new sewage 
waste water disposal plant.

Rev. Stovall Will 
Bring Messages Sun.

Rev. Bruce Stovall will be 
bringing both messages Sun-

The beginning of the I^oyal 
Lundstrom murder trial was 
in prospect for Monday as 
jury selection continued Fri­
day after four days of ques­
tioning by state and defense 
attorneys had produced nine 
jurors. The Cisco business 
man is charged with murder 
in the March 3rd shotgun 
death of his wife.

Selected to serve on the 
jury throughout Thursday 
were Stew art Mack 
Farguhar, retired Ciscoan; 
Jack Lindsey, Eastland; 
Kay Lynn t.asater, KasQantl 
housewife; Jamie Boswell 
Smith, Eastland housewife;

City Budget 
Is On File 
With Secretary

The 1983-84 Annual Budget 
for the City of Cisco will be 
on file  with the City 
Secretary as of Monday, 
August 29,1983. Citizens may 
review the budget at City 
Hall during normal working 
hours - 8:00 a.m. to 5:(X) 
p.m., Monday through Fri­
day.

The budget w ill be 
presented to the Council for 
their approval at their 
meetings on September 13 
and September 27,1983.

Ginger Johnson 
City Secretary

day at the East Cisco Baptist 
Church, according to an an­
nouncement here this week.

Ronald Dean Keeney, Texas 
Electric Service Company 
employee, Eastland; Gayle 
Chaney, Chaney and Sons 
Butane, Eastland; David A. 
G r iffin , R ising  Star, 
employed by Superior (Dable 
Co. in Brownwood; Edwin P. 
Davidson, Olden, employed 
by EBB A Iron Co., and 
Deborah Ann Drake of 
R an ger , em p loyed  by 
Ranger General Hospital.

Mrs. Drake was the only 
juror selected during panel 
exam ination  T hursday, 
some W persons nafl t*en 
questioned for the jury 
through Thursday.

At mid-afternoon Friday, 
two more jurors were need­
ed. Two had been picked 
ea r lie r  F r id a y : B ruce 
Stovall of Cisco and Belva 
Sublett oi Elastland. Debra 
Drake of Ranger who had 
been selected Thursday was 
released from service, by 
permission.

Defense Attorney Bill Hart 
told this newspaper Friday 
that no decision has been 
made as to whether Lund­
strom will take the stand 
during his trial.

District Attorney Emory 
Walton reported that the 
state would present some 15 
witnesses.

Most of the prospective 
jurors questioned so far have 
been excused “ for cause” .

Both defense and prosecu­
tion have ten strikes each

with which they can reject a 
juror without stating a 
reason. This affords both 
defense and prosecution the 
opportunity to exclude 
jurors who they feel might 
not be sympathetic to their 
side.

Through mid-morning Fri­
day, the defense had used 
three strikes and the pro­
secution two strikes.

At 10:30 Friday morning, 
the second prospective juror 
of the day was being ques­
tioned.

m  mw ie.tt tinny preepectwe
jurors, Mr. Walton indicated 
that testimony would not re­
quire more than two or three 
days. Attorney Hart inquired 
of several potential jurors 
whether they thought it 
would matter to a jury if 
Lundstrom did not testify.

L undstrom , fre e  on 
$200,000 property bond, has 
appeared daily with his at­
torney in the courtroom. He 
sits quietly, paying strict at­
tention to jury questioning. 
He is always neatly dressed.

The Lundstroms owned 
and operated the Cisco Motel 
and a monument business in 
(Tisco for some 10 years. 
Both were active in church 
and community affairs and 
appeared frequently in 
public with their five  
children.

Mrs. Lundstrom's PoOy 
was found in the bedroom of 
their motel apartment on 
March 5. An autopsy in­
dicated that she had died of a 
shotgun blast 36 or more 
hours earlier Lundstrom 
had disappeared and gave 
himself up 13 days later.

CofC Quarterly 
Breakfast Is Set

The Cisco Chamber of 
C om m erce  Q u arterly  
Breakfast Committee has 
set the date for the next 
breakfast. It will take place 
at the White Elephant 
Restaurant in the Elephant 
Room  on T h u rsday , 
September 1, 1983 at 7:00 
a.m. We will be welcoming 
all the new teachers to our

school system. We will also 
be reportin g  on the 
Chamber’s activities during 
the past few months as well 
as those planned in the 
future. Anyone who is in­
terested in attending the 
breakfast should contact the 
Chamber of Commerce of­
fice at 442-2537 for reserva­
tions.

City Applies For Grant For Paving

Septic Systems Install­
ed.
Don Wallace. 
44^4<^7.p-7L

CLSCO Kin 
CAR WASH 

3rd St. and Ave. E 
Where Most Peoplel 
Wash. Wash your V en e­
tian blinds, throw mgs, | 
Dfltor.

The City Council authoriz­
ed the filing of an application 
with the Texas Department 
of Community Affairs for a 
grant of $278.(XX) for use in 
street improvements at the 
semi-monthly meeting Tues­
day night at City Hall

the action followed the se­
cond public hearing on the 
Texas Community Develop­
ment program application. 
City Manager Mike Moore 
reported to the council that 
some $835.000 in federal 
grants were available in the 
27-county Council of Govern­
ment area and that Cisco 
was competing with a dozen 
or more cities for the funds.

The grant, if approved, 
will be used for drainage 
structures and paving in the 
north and east sections of 
town, Mr. Moore said.

An ordinance establishing 
the 1984 city tax rate at 52 
cents per $100 valuation was 
approved as an emergency 
measure to allow work to 
begin on 1984 tax statements. 
Only one reading is required 
on emergency matters. The 
new rate, approved at a 
m eeting last m onth, 
represents an increase of 
about three per cent over 
1983.

An ordinance to allow the 
use of polybutylene plastic 
pipe for water service was

approved on first reading. 
Use of this pipe was recom­
mended by Water Depart­
ment Superintendent Leon 
Boles and City Manager 
Moore. Mr. Moore was also 
given permission to study 
the city’s plumbing code for 
the purpose of updating it.

A resolution requesting the 
governor to include an ap­
propriation bill for the 
municipal courts education 
fund on the agenda for any 
forthcoming special sessions 
of the legislature was ap­
proved. City Judge Jasper 
Cook reported that 50 cents 
for each fine levied in city 
courts goes into an education 
fund for judges and others 
connected with the courts 
and that enabling legislation 
was needed to spend the 
funds.

An oil well drilling permit 
was approved for the Kelly- 
Barnett Petroleum Co. to 
drill their No. 1 L.H Rhodes 
in the city limits

The Council approved a 
lease agreement with Pride 
M arketing of T exas, 
Abilene, to sell aviation fuel 
at the Cisco Municipal Air 
port. The firm will use a 
2,000 gallon underground 
storage tank owned by the ci­
ty at the airport and in.stall a 
modern pumping equip­
ment. The city will get fi\

cents per gallon on all sales. 
A key system will allow local 
pilots to service their own 
aircraft.

The 1983-84 budget of the 
Eastland County Dispatch, 
which provides 24-hour 
emergency telephone, radio 
and teletype service for the 
county and five of its cities at 
a headquarters office in 
Eastland, was approved. 
The new budget totals 
$72,619, up about 10 per cent 
over last year's.

The Dispatch has five full­
time employees who get a 
20-cent per hour pay in­
crease under the new 
budget The budget funds for 
the com ing year are 
a lloca ted  as fo llow s : 
Eastland County, $18,494 
(28.8 per cent i; City of Cisco, 
$14,898 (23.2 per cent); City 
of Eastland, $12,329 (19.2 per 
cen t); City of Ranger, 
$10,403 (16.2 per cent); City 
of Gorman, $4,110 (6 4 per 
cent) and City of Rising Star, 
$3,981 (6.2 per cent).

In addition, Patterson Am­
bulance Service pays $600 
annually toward the budget, 
and Texas Electric Service 
Co and Comanche County 
REA each pay $1,860. Odessa 
Natural Gas Co. contributes 
$2,280

The Council, voting 4-1 for 
the budget, noted that the

alternative would be for 
each city to operate its own 
central emergency center.

The monthly financial 
statement was submitted by 
City A ccountant Pablo 
Rodriguez. It showed a 
working fund balance of 
$40,219 at the end of July as 
compared with $56,127 at the 
end of June. Heavy expenses 
in the street and utility 
departments were cited as 
the cause of the drop.

City M anager M oore 
reported that oil and gas in­
come for July was $7,141 to 
bring the year’s total to 
$40,219. Since August 1, he 
added, the city has received 
some $12,000 from a gas well 
where royalty payments had 
been held up pending title 
clarification.

General fund collections 
for July amounted to $61,729 
while the fund had expenses 
of $93,585. The utility fund 
had income of $31,691 and ex­
penses of $60,331.

Present were Mayor Eris 
Ritchie, Councilmen Bobby 
Ingram, Bobby Rains, Roy 
Dennis, Brad Kimbrough 
and Linton Batteas, City 
M anager M oore, City 
Secretary Ginger Johnson, 
City Attorney Billy Wright, 
Water Superintendent Leon 
Boles and City Judge Jasper 
Cook.

CISCO GIRL Scouts lost the use of their meeting house here Tuesday 
night due to a fire of unknown origin. Most of the fire damage was con­
tained to the west end of the building, but a number of articles inside the 
building were lost, (staff photo)

Girl Scout House Is 
Damaged By Fire Here

Fire of undertermined 
orgin caused extensive 
damages to the building and 
equipment at the Girl Scout 
Hut on West 15th Street last 
Tuesday night. The Cisco 
Volunteer Fire Department 
received a call on the fire at 
7:20 p.m.

The building, which was 
originally the railroad depot 
at Carbon, was pretty well 
gutted. Fire Chief C.W. 
Guthrie reported. The wall

sheetrock, floors and roof 
also had damage, although 
the building framework ap­
peared to be in fair c«idi- 
tion, he said. Mr. Guthrie 
said damages could run as 
high as $12,000.

There was exten sive  
damage to the building’s 
contents, including a piano, 
work tables and equipment 
and supplies, Mr. Guthrie 
said. There had been no 
meetings In the building

since last May.
It was understood that the 

Girl Scout Associatin carried 
insurance on both the 
building and equipment, and 
adjusters were here Thurs­
day.

On Tuesday, September I, 
a meeting to plan for tiie 
future of the Girl Scout pro­
gram will be held. There will 
be more information on the 
place and tim e of the 
meeting in a future edition.
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SUBSCRIPTION
RATES:

In Eastland County 
$14. In Adjoining 
Counties $18. In 
other Texas Coun­
ties $20. Out of 
Texas $25. No out- 
o f - c o n t i n e n t a l  
United States ex­
cept for APOs.

NOTICE: Unless you have established credit 

with the Cisco Press all classified ads must| 

be poid in advance.

T Á M E I N E R

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION
IM I'OKTANT 

( hrrk xnur ad the 
l-'irvt l>a\ It appi'urs In 
cx fiil III rrron ,. picas«' 
«a ll im m c d ia t f lx  (n 
haxr il ■̂l•̂ ^̂ •̂ •t̂ ■d. N«i 
claiiiis Hill In- alliiHcd 
for m ore than on«- in< o r  
ri-rt inscrtnin.

The puhlish<-rs liahdi- 
t> shall In- liniiti-d to oli­
li thf amount of spar«- 
ronsuim-ii In thi-v- «-r- 
rors.

c NOTICE

DOZER SERVICE 
Tanking, brush pushingl 
and all types of dirt| 
Hork. $3S per hour 
Minimum 4 hours. Call| 
Rob Hallmark. 442-2127 
p-tfr

NOTICE: For home
delivery of the Abilene 
Reporter News' If you li\e 
north of 8th Street or west of 
Avenue N call Morgan Flem­
ing. 442-3031 p«tfc

WILLUMS 
CONSTRL'CnON 
& INSULATION 

For all your New! 
Home*, Rem odeling 
and Metal Construction | 
needs. 442-1933. p-14tfc

In ONE FAMILY Out | 
OF 5. MOTHER (lets a 
JOB To Help PAY For a 
CHILD'S UNIVER.SITY 
EDUCATION. LIFE IN­
SURANCE Can Help 
AVOID THIS!

“ Hollis Williams Con­
struction"

Him a rrllakwe tuulallM. melai 
(-•«ulrartloo. o n  iMmei. <-iMlani 
riMarU. roarrrle. rlertrlral aark 

,aad otter remadellBf aeedi
441- I t »  TC

TIM BARTON 
Construction 
& Insulation 

New Homes, add-ons. 
cabinets, metal const., 
con crete , e lectr ica l 
work & blown cellulose 
Insuiatiofl. Cali 442-3727 
a fter  5. 442-4049
daytime. p-59tfc

i i i i i i i i i n f f l i

CONSTRUCTION
<4 «9-2 -1709

Rwmodwiing, Add-ons, New Homes, 

Cobinets, Electricol Etc Free Estimates

C.T, Wagner 
OiUield 

Roustabouting 
Spray painting. Tank! 
moving, Test Tanks 
Road time out of Cisco 

R ising Star, Tx.| 
817-M3-1515. p-39tnl.

CUSTOM MOVABLE 
HOMF.S

We handle it all from 
drawing your blueprint to a 
turn-key job on custom 
movable homes. All sizes 
and all prices to any stage of 
com pletion . Call (915) 
646-5^4, for brochure or 
com e by Highway 183, 
Brown w ood, to E arly  
Lumber p-ltfc.

OLIVER WEST 
Water Well Service 

2«z mi.. So. Rising Star 
*3 to 2 H.P. in stock 

8I7-843-4683 
Call Anytime

Taylor Center Laundry 
Wash 

SO cents 
100 Ave. D 

TF

GARAGE SALE; Starts at 8 
a m., Saturday, Aug. 27, at 
form er Lew is Starr 
residence, 900 W. 9th. Cisco. 
p-69

INSIDE HOUSEHOLD 
SALE; Dinette set, mattress 
and spring, small appliances 
and odds & ends. Cheap. 712 
E. 9th. Friday, Saturday and 
Sunday, p-69

B.D. Green's Used Cars 
Ml East 8th St.

We sell new & used 
tires. Fix flats, Car 

FlaU 12.50
We appreciate yonr 

buslness.p-72

NOTICE: Kiwanis Club oi 
Cisco will pick up any type 
merchandise of value for 
fund raising rummage sale. 
Call 442-2320, leave address. 
p-78

150 REWARD: For return of 
1 large 2 year-old brown 
tiger-striped heifer. Ear tag 
*59. Brown on upper left hip 
*2. Strayed from my place 
Southwest of Cisco. Call col­
lect (915) 893-4015 day or 
(915 ) 893-5536 night. p«9

SONIC DRIVE-IN 
Now taking applicatins for 
part-time employment. App­
ly in person from 10:00 a.m. 
till 11:00 a.m. p49

FOR SA LE : R e­
conditioned bicycles, 
mowers, tillers, mini­
bike, edgers. Bicycle 
and mower repair. 408 
West 10th. p-73

TO GIVE AWAY

TO GIVE AWAY: Three full- 
grown cats. Two males and 
one female. Call 442-2757 
after 5 p.m. on weekdays and 
anytime on weekends. 
p-69tfc

FOR RENT: One bedroom 
house. Clean, recently  
remodeled. Available Sept. 
1. $200 month. $100 deposit. 
442-2320 or 442-3338. p-70

FOR RENT: Real nice small 
two bedroom house for rent. 
Furnished or unfurnished. 
Phone 442-1461. p89

"^tnyone wko needs l 
Stanley Home Products I 
Cnll 442-2127. I will| 
order it for yon.

Clam H^m ark 
Dealer,

Cisco, Texas p-70

FOR RENT; Nice partially 
furnished, 1 bedroom house, 
$150 month, $50 deposit. 
Water paid. 6134 E. 23rd. 
442-1305 or 442-4606 after 5 
p.m. p-69

9 to do baby-sitting in my •
WANTED: I would like§ a
home. E xperienced. 
Call Becky Reynolds. S 
4424502. p-73 |

999— 9m t ------------------

Thrift Shop 
Home again 

Big load of new clothes:
4  price.

Lots of readingji 
material.

New jeans: $11.M 
442-2S04.P-69

FOR RENT: New office 
■ y e w  wvwitaMa , Yws
tell us the size office you 
need. Call 442-3024. 
p45tfc.

HOUSE FOR RENT: 
Small 2 bedroom. Fur­
nished or unfurnished. 
703.E. 14th. p-74

N OTICE: B usiness 
records & bookkeeping 
services, income tax 
returns, m onthly & 
quarterly reporting for 
business, fin a n cia l 
statements, individual, 
partnership, corpora­
tion, notary public ser­
vice. Goode Business 
Service, 205 W. llth, 
Cisco. 442-3044. p-74

MOBILE HOME 
SPACE FOR LEASE: 
One acre tract. 142-3330. 
p-4tfc

MINI WAREHOUSE 
STORAGE as low as $20 
month. Call 442-3340, 
Cisco. p-57tfc

ADVERTISE
y o u r  C a ra g e  S a le

HJ TUP

CLASSIFIED ADS

OFFICE 
SUPPLIES

ot the
ICISCO PRESS 

442-2244

Washer-Dryer-Refrigeration Repair
V\*

•«■ *r C T

Ted Parrish
Route 2 

Box 240A-1
Cisco, Texas

'5  T ears

Formeriy Foctory Service

YOU NEED A TV CABLE CONNEaiON 

for complete television enjoyment 

★  ★  ★

[Southern Television Systems Corpt

Serving Otco, Eoettond, Ranger 

CoH US tor complete informotion

WAVTED Bird huotlog leair 
lor 4 lo ( rrtpooilblo hiutora. SM 
to 2.M0 arm. PIraK ropl) P.U. 
Box 4M. Gladoaalor, Trxat. 
7ÌM7 or Pboor )tl4) M1-Ì314. 
P-71

WANT TO BUY: Oil and 
gas leases especially 
abandoned wells and 
step-outs. W rite K. 
Rumbaugh, Box 478, 
Cross Plains, 76443 or 
phone 817-725^91 after 
7 p.m. p-77

FOR SALE

FOR SALE; 1978 Olds 
Cutlass Station Wagon, three 
seats, new tires, new ex­
haust system, good paint 
job, $1800. Also, a 1977 Ford 
LTD, pretty Interior, air con­
ditioned, good motor and 
transmission, $1500. Call 
after 5 p.m. on weekdays or 
anytim e on w eekends, 
442-2757. p-69tfc

FOR SALE: 1962 Ford Ran­
chero. 1966 Rivers in-board, 
out-board, 16 ft. 442-4936.

FOR SALE: 1972 Buick Elec- 
tra, 455 motor, power seats, 
windows. New tires. FM and 
tape deck added. On Scran­
ton road, FM 1864, seven 
miles S.W. of Cisco, p-70

CARD OF THANKS
I wish to express my ap­

p rec ia tion  and many 
THANKS to all my friendis 
for visits, cards, calls and 
gifts during my stay in the 
hospital.

Special thanks to Dr. Addy 
and Dr. Cermin and all the 
nurses and staff at the 
hospital.

May God Bless all of you 
real well.

Ben Weiser

FOR SALE: 1982 Kawasaki 
CSR-650. Call after 4:00 
p.m., 442-4845. p-70

c FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Watermelons, 
cantalopes and black-eye 
peas. Conrad Schaefer farm. 
12 miles South of Cisco, p-71

FOR SALE: 36 gallon pro­
pane tank with system. Call 
442-3031 after 7:00 p.m., if in­
terested. p-69

FOR SALE large air com­
pressor for a station or shop. 
Reasonably priced. 643-2563. 
3Mtp ^

sure 
cure:

15
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FOR SALE: 1975 trailer 
house 14’ X 75’ . 3 Bedroom, 
kitchen, living room. Central 
heat, good condition. $7,500. 
Needs to be moved. (512) 
673-8721. Can be seen at 407 
E. 8th. p-75

FOR SALE; 1982 Mazda Plu, 
AC and H, 5 speed, low 
mileage, 1978 VW Rabbit 
hatchback, sun roof, goad 
tires, 30 plus mpg and 12 ft. 
a lum inum  A rkansas 
Traveler V bottom boat, 
442-3725 or see at 1701 Ave. L, 
Cisco.

Very beautifnl three bedroom, two bath frame, with 
two room and bath servant quarters In rear, feaced 
back yard sitting on ab4>ut two blocks of very good 
ground, with large shed, new on the market and very 
desirable, $55,000.00

Very nice 5 room frame with large garage and 
storage building on paved street and go<Ml location, 
$32,5000.00

Attractive brick, roomy, with large walk-ln closets, 
best part of town, and very well worth $55,000.00

You wlU like this one, very sol’d frame, good yard 
and only $15,000.00

We have several g04)d 5 room dwellings priced from 
$15,000.00 to $19,500.00 ask about them, one has 10 lots
with it.  ̂ . j

We, also, have brick dwellings of all kinds. Inside and 
outside of the city limits, you can have one story or two 
story’s, and we want to sell them.

We have two story frame dwellings, commercial 
buildings, 80 A. land, you name It (small tracto are all 
sold).

WE ARE DOING BUSINESS AND WANT TO DO 
MORE!! REMEMBER THE CONTENTS OF THIS AD 
IS ONLY A SMALL PORTION OF THE PROPERTY 
WE HAVE TO SELL, I MEAN WE HAVE IT!! JUST 

. TELL US WHAT YOU WANT..

807 Ave. D., G sco

Gorl D- Gorr : 
Real Estate Brokerage

Three soles men to assist in a l phases 
of the work. 442-3642 or, night 442-1642

FOR SALE: 1972 Ford 
Maverick, metal goat 
traUer and geese. Call 
442-1447. p-71

REAL e s t a t e ]

FOR SALE: 12’x64’ mobUe 
home with 12’x24’ room built 
on. Two fenced lots, several 
fruit trees, garden spot. 1006 
sq. f t  Call 442-2578. p-70

FOR SALE: 5 bedroom 
home. 1000 West 6th, Cisco. 
D ow nsta irs com p le te ly  
re d e co ra te d . $46,500. 
442-2366 or 442-1993. p-i8tnf.

X k

Cisco Press

FOR SALE: Two bedroom 
rock house for sale by owner. 
Garage and extra room in 
back. Low equity and take 
up payments. (Tall 442-3729 or 
442-2346. p49

HOUSE FOR SALE: To be 
moved. (Tall after 4:30 p.m., 
442-3127. p-70

SACRIFICE SALE: Cabin at 
Lake C isco . M odified  
A -fram e, cedar siding, 
carpet, full bath, boat 
storage, loading ramp, nice­
ly furnished. Sleeps seven 
co m fo r ta b ly . O w ner - 
915-677-1269. p-69

FOR SALE: 3 or 4 
bdnn., Ig. kitchen & liv­
ing room, carport & 
utility building, m  lots, 
FHA approved. Assume 
loan & $2500 phis $45 
tran sfer fee . Call 
915-758-5972. p-76

FOR SALE: Lake Cisco pro­
perty, double lot, easy ac­
cess, south side, 3 bedroom, 

• l ‘'k bath, mobile home with 
large living area added, 
covered docks, nice portable 
building, year-round deep 
water. Need to see to ap­
preciate. Will consider nice 
motor home trade-in. Call 
(915) 677-2033 or (915) 
677-1349 . p-77

HOUSE TO BE MOVED by 
buyer. Partially remodeled. 
Hurry for best price before 
further remodeling. Located 
in Scranton. 442-4683. p-69

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 
b d ., ce n tra l H /A , 
garage, com er lot, lots 
of oak and pecan trees, 
fireplace. Owner carry 
some financing. Call 
915/283-3588. See at 700 
E. 20th. p47tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
Large 3 bedroom house on 2 
lots, excellent investment. 
Assume $9200.00 note. Owner 
carry small second note. 
CaU 512-288-0749. p48tnf

D r i n k i n g

D r i v i n g

D e a t h

A Comhination we 
CAN T LIVE WITH'

IDAVIES MONUMENT WORKSI
Completed In Our Shop 

Also Last Dates, Curbing

Harold Davies Owner 
401 N. 5

442-4082 Cisco,
442-3523

p-Nc

'W W W W W W W W W 'W*

BaKoon fm ita sy

Balloon bouquets delivered for 

any special occos/on. A c/own 
will deliver the message of y o u r ^  

choice to business, home, hospital •  
or wherever you desire. Give ^  

something different to. the one you love.
Linda Sellstrom - 442-30^

KlalKins
SERVED 

FAMILY STYLE 
SINCE 1868
Th(»se famnû MaiA' I- 

prduri' you renicm)er V.ni'lu 
(Jnnamon. Lmuiieni. y.iC» .jkI 
Herbs are asaJaNe at so'ir «kK»r 
lust gne me a call

REAI ESTATE

S/A - i i 2 - 3 8 4 6

I 404 W. 9th. Spacious 3 bdnn. 2 bth. home with central 
A/H on 3 lots, pecan trees. Small rent house in back.

I $55,000.

1209 Mancill, Neat frame, 2 bedroom, 1 bath, den 
I with fireplace, carport, storm windows. $36,500

1207 W. 12th, 2 bedroom, stucco home, large lot, all 
fenced, $25,000.

Northside Ijike Cisco, cabin on pretty wooded lot, 
with dock and deep water. $18,000.

Overlooking Lake Cisco golf course. 5 bdrm., 3 bath,
I formal living, w/fireplace, dining room, den, utility 
I and two car garage. $125,000.

1407 Simms, three good size bedrooms, game room, 2 1 
bath, double sided fireplace, fenced yard. In good 
neighborhood. $74,500.

Anita Webb, Associate, 44^354«
Sharon WUcoxen, 44M849

9 - i 2  / - J

NEW BRICK HOME
3 Bedroom-2 Bath House In New Kimber I..ea Estates

Country Living with City Water & Nat. Gas & W* T* U*
Price *33,500.00

cinnamon

Building Lots For Sale 

Build Your Plant or Ours

Construction By 

C & S Construction 
442-3I4B442-15B0

Nel Speers Barker
10f> Ave. G

442-3117 442 1378

SALES
Chamness Realtors «I42-31«48 «142-11«64

* art,
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Spotlights & 
Sidelights Personalizing Christmas

Julia W orthy

For those of you who are 
nimble with neither needle 
nor hammer, there are plen­
ty of w ays to m ake 
C hristm as m em orable  
without Neim an-M arcus 
ca ta log -even  without a 
Sears catalog.

The bakers are about as 
far out in front now as the 
wood-workers are with less 
consumable craft products. 
The family magazines are 
full of timely tips for foods 
that tease the tongue.

With freezers it’s easy to 
bake and store-or give- 
ahead of time, especially if 
the person favored is no 
longer so brisk about baking.

Countywide 

Senior Citizen

Bazaar Set

County Fair
Home Craft
Set8 Meeting

U.S. DEPT. Inierior 
Geological Survey 

T o p o g r a p h i c  
Quadrangle 

MAPS 
of Eastland County 

now nvailable

$3.00 ea. plus tax 
at tne

EASTLAND 
TELEGRAM  

110 W. Commerce 
Eastland

She or he might appreciate 
an early fruit cake for pre­
holiday snacks.

In fact, with all the stores 
so very beforehand with 
“ Christmas gift" sales, you 
might begin your own giving 
as soon as you have cleared 
away the damages from 
Thanksgiving.

By all means feaure your 
fancies, tastiest superlatives 
in the receipe Imes, but cook 
them in give-away pans and 
deliver in the same kind of 
dishes if you transfer from 
baking pans to serving 
dishes.

It used to be safe enough to 
use a nice plate and tape 
your name to the bottom of 
it. The dish often returned 
filled with another special 
goodie. This could still be an 
intention of your giftee, but 
these are dishwasher days, 
and tape no longer is quite

the answer. Even if the 
dishpan or sink still serves, 
it is possible someone else 
will be doing dishes, and 
there goes your identifica­
tion on your plate.

Anyway, stick a red bow 
on a saran -w rapped , 
aluminum foil pan of mun- 
chies and there’s your gift, 
wrap, and no dish to be 
retumed-or forgotten.

There are so many 
holiday-decorated paper 
plates that there is no need to 
risk losing a “ Good ’un.”  
Maybe I think more about 
this because I collect plates, 
and I can’t bear to part with 
even a scroungey one. That 
is going to change this very 
year.

1 have promised myself to 
begin to part with some 
plates and other things this 
C h ristm as...n ot the 
scroungey stuff, either. It is 
time to distribute some of 
the family pieces collected

over years and years and 
years of pack-ratting.

I never expect him to use 
it, but I will box and store my 
grandfather’s shaving stand 
for Darrell, his first great- 
great-grandson. My grand­
mother’s sewing basket goes 
to her first great-great- 
g ra n d d a u g h e r-o n  my 
branch of the family tree. It 
is true that these things may 
gladden the heart of some 
future garage-sale shopper, 
but I will have provided a 
chance for family continuity 
with one small bit. Most of us 
have a sentimental streak 
that responds to the idea of 
being a link in a family chain 
of relationships. You may be 
an orphan and know nothing 
about your family. Begin a 
chain with yourself.

Relative to the beginning 
of your own chain: one of my 
favorite pieces of furniture is 
a roll-top desk we bought 
over at Moody about twenty-

five years ago. in discussing 
which of our young’uns 
might want the old things we 
have, I remarked that the 
desk was “ old, but not a 
family piece”  David hopped 
on that at once. "Mom, it is 
in my family”  Yep, he gets 
it...but not yet.

Alter his rebuke, I dusted 
off my perspective to see 
that it doesn’t do to confine 
yourself to one viewpoint. 
Those pink glasses I dug out 
of oatmeal boxes when I was 
Mandi’s age are not just 
■ premiums’ ’ any longer. 
They are “ depression  
glass’ ’ , and you can buy a lot 
of oatmeal for what they’ll 
cost you.

Another gift no one else 
can give is your time. Be a 
visitor, but not only at

holidays. Offer to run er­
rands for those who no 
longer drive...or take them 
with you. Mail letters-even 
write letters if you know 
there is a vision problem or 
fingers are stiff with ar­
thritis. Swap books, take a 
trip to the library, or drive 
around town to see what’s 
building, selling, tom down, 
or who’s moved.

gift.
Use your imagination and 

I’ll use mine for a more per­
sonal g ift -g iv in g  this 
Christmas...and start soon.

M andi te lls  m e that 
Christmas gifts, like birth­
day presents, are “ ’posed to 
be hidden.”  Better put a lock 
on the closet, too!

HEIDENHEIMER'S

Sidewalk Sale
This next is not a jolly sug­

gestion, but what some of the 
eldest citizens really would 
like is a visit to the cemetery 
to check on the graves of the 
dear departed. I admit to 
mixed emotions about such 
expenditions, but I know 
enough people who dote on 
'em to give the idea a men­
tion here. It definitely would 
be an unusual Christmas

Bargains
Sat. Aug. 27

Simplicity Patterns
Sorted by Size 
Your Choice

TREMENDOUS TABLE SALE!
TOP QUALITY ALL WOOD OCCASIONAL TAILES

YOUR CHOICE t‘ÜBL
Boy’s Short Sleeve

Dress Shirts
The 1983 Countywide 

Senior Citizen Bazaar will be 
on November 3 and 4 in 
Eastland.

The committee met this 
week to plan the Bazaar. At­
tending the planning 
meeting were Mrs. Alberta 
Sims and Mrs. Ruth Cartee, 
both of Cisco: Mrs. Dorothy 
U nderw ood, of M orton 
Valley: and Mrs. Arleta 
Shirey, Mrs. Edith Wilson 
and Mrs. Ruth Kendrick, all 
of Eastland.

Special plans were made 
to include a Golden Recep­
tion honoring couples mar­
ried 50 years or longer which 
will be on November 3rd. 
Also in conjunction with the 
Bazaar will be a Pioneer 
Day on November 4th which 
will feature a fashion parade 
of old hats and bonnets along 
with yesterday’s fashions.

This year’s Bazaar pro­
mises to be bigger and better 
than ever. Complete Bazaar 
rules will be published in the 
near future announces Mrs. 
Janet Thomas, County Ex­
tension Agent.

All senior citizens in the 
county who would like to ex­
hibit and sale their hand­
made articles are encourag­
ed to come.

The theme for the annual 
event is “ Holiday Bazaar”  
and this will be an occasion 
for the public to shop for 
some Christmas gifts at 
resonable prices.

Womens Missionary League
To Sponsor Octoberfest

On Friday, October 7 from 
8:00 a m. to 6:00 p.m. and 
Saturday, October 8 from 
8:00 a m. to 12:00 noon, the 
Lutheran Womens Mis­
sionary I>eague of Redeemer 
Lutheran Church is sponsor­
ing an Octoberfest Bazaar.

The bazaar will have 
booths featuring home cann­
ed foods and jellies, home 
grown farm and garden pro­
duce, homemade cakes, 
pies, cookies and candies, 
and homemade crafts. A 
new booth this year will 
feature frozen foods with 
their recipes.

A stew dinner will be serv­
ed k’ riday, October 7, from 
11:30 a.m. to 1:00 p.m. 
Tickets are, adults $3.00 and 
children $1.50. A sausage 
and biscuit breakfast with 
butter, jelly and choice of 
drink will be srved Saturday 
morning, October 8.

Proceeds from all sales 
will go to the parish hall 
renovation project and the 
LWML general treasury for 
mission work.

Make plans to attend the 
Octoberfest Bazaar, October 
7 and 8 at R edeem er 
Lutheran Parish Hall, Ave. 
D and East 18th.

Value* to *8.95

•2.98
Men’* & Boy’* 
Short Sleeve

Western Shirts
Broken Size*

AUSwim Suits & Shorts
Ladies, Girl*, Men*, Boy*

Price

|One Big Rack of Ladies & Men’s
Summer Goods at

YourFomSy store in Cisco

Majestic Theatre
Eastland 629-1220

One Showing Only Each Evening 
Open 7:.30 Show Start* At 7:50 PJM.

There will be a meeting on 
Friday, Septemer 2 at 10 
a.m. in the Eastland Naional 
Bank Community Room for 
all volunteer workers in the 
County Fair Home Craft 
division.

The Home Craft division 
includes the following divi­
sions: clothing, baked goods, 
preserved foods, handcrafts, 
ceramics, and horticulture. 
Mrs. Dorothy Underwood, of 
Morton Valley, will be the 
overall chairman.

The Home Craft division is 
still in need of some more 
volunteer workers states 
Mrs. Underwood. Anyone in­
terested in volunteering to 
help with these booths are 
urged to attend the Friday, 
September 2 meeting or call 
Mrs. Underwood at 647-1903, 
or Janet Thomas, County 
Extension Agent, 629-2222.

The Eastland County Fair 
dates are September 29, 30, 
and October 1.

Experience the
J.R. Hair Experience 

FuU Barber & Beautv Service 
709 Conrad Hilton Cisco, Texas

New ServiceN

wofftat

Sun., Mon., Tue.
Bargoin Nife Tues. All Seots $1.50

(
Full Tim* Noil Car* Specialists for: Manicures. Pedicures, 

Sculptured Nails and Sculptured Tips.

FOR MEN- Complete Shoe Shine Service Come In A 

Get A  Shine or Bring Them In A Leave Them.

\\A i:r D IS N E V S

precision Punk Cut 
I Designer Perm Style Highlighted

Lobo & JR’h 
Fatnily Hair Care Center 

442-9979 or 442-3551

/

a/Á
.C l

Ranger Drive-In
Ranger 647-3802 Theatre
One Showing Only Each Evening 

Open 8:.30 Showtime 9:0» P.M.

Sun., & Mon. Only
Burt Reynolds & Loni Anderson

What a guy. What a gal. What a pair!

I.

Kirby
f t Oov,erVACUUM

CLEANER
CITY No. 7

1200 W. Main 
Eaetland, Texas

Kirby
Authonzed Sales & Service

Parts - Service - Supplies 
on All Makes & Models

817-629-8732 TF

-M.

\
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PGsMarriti

Univefsal Pleines and Wama Bros Piesent A WALM VKOOO Produclion 
AHAl NEEDHAM Pilni BURl RErnDS^mK AŒ' 

NEDBEAm JMNABORS PARKBI STEVENSON and LdANOERSONiEi» 
Screefday bv HUGH WISON and HAL NEEDHAM
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Caiible Drilling To Drill South O f Cisco
Cauble Drilling Co. of 

Albany is preparing to drill 
two 2,000-ft developmental 
wells in Eastland County-s 
Adobe F'lled, 11 miles south 
of Cisco. The wells will be 
known as the No. 1 Olson 
“ C" and No. 2 Olson “ A.”  
They are situated in a 
40-acre d rillin g  unit, 
H&TCRR Survey Sec 98Blk 
3

Operating out of Fort 
W orth, Chase-M ann 
Petroleum Inc has staked 
locations for a pair of re­
entry ventures northwest of 
Eastland

Involved in the ventures is 
the No 1 M A Clyatt, 
located m a 65-acre lease m 
the H&TCRR Survey Sec 31 
Blk 4, and No 1 Parish,

located in an 80-acre lease in 
the H4TCRR Survey sec. 42 
Blk 4

The Clyatt well is slated 
for total depth of 3,570 feet. 
The Parish carries permit 
for 4,000 feet of hole. Both 
wells are in the P. Cameron 
Field, three and five miles 
northwest of Eastland, 
respectively.

F'astland-based C.R. Tar­
rant Production Co. has 
staked location for the No. 2 
C.R Ray in Eastland Coun­
ty’s George Field. It will be 
aimed at Strawn Formation 
natural gas pay

Ixication is in a 100-acre 
lease in the R.C. Forbes 
Survey A-1131. Projected 
total depth is 1,650 feet.

Oil Instruments
Robert Snook To Robert 

Snook it Others Par Asgn 
OGMl.

Sunbelt Tank Co. Inc. & 
others to Triple R Oil & Gas 
Abstract of Judg.

Sunbelt Well Serv. Inc & 
others to Angell Petroleum 
Inc Abstract of Judg.

Sunbelt Well Serv. Inc. To 
W atterw orth  Oil Ins. 
Abstract of Judg.

Charles R Tyler To PHI 
Resources Ltd. OGL 

Myrtle V. Tyler by A/F & 
■4K»rm T o  PHI K eoew ee»
Ltd OGL

Cleoves Rhea Thompson 
To PHI Resources Ltd. OGL 

Helen Foote Thornton to 
PHI Resources Ltd. OGL 

l,orene Tinsley To PHI 
Resouf (*s Ltd. OGL

Trinity Exploration Co. To 
Ray Richey & Co Inc. Asgn 
OG lyeasehold Est 

Trinity Exploration Co. To 
Ray Richey it Co. Inc Asgn 
OG l>easehold Est

Trinity Exploration Co. To 
Ray Richey 4  Co. Inc. Asgn 
OG l<easehold Est.

Trinity Exploration Co. To 
Ray Richey it Co. Inc. Asgn 
OG I..easehold Est 

Trinity Exploration Co To 
Ray Richey it Co. Inc Asgn 
OG 1/easehold Est.

Trinity Exploration Co. To 
Ray Richey 4  Co. Inc. Asgn 
OG I,easehold Est 

Tri-Co. Oil Corp 4  others 
To Western Prod co. Asgn of 
Conveyance

Jannie Wiegand To PHI 
Resources Ltd. OGL 

Estelle C. Work To PHI 
Resources Ltd. OGL 

J.L . White To PHI 
Resources Ltd. OGL 

Horace White To PHI 
Resources Ltd OGL 

Clayton White to PHI 
Resources Ltd. OGL 

Carlton White To PHI 
Resources Ltd. OGL 

Elsie White Westmoreland 
To PHI Resources Ltd. OGL 

Sam W-. White . Jc. To PHI
OCA»- n n M | -

Idell Westbrook To PHI 
Resources Ltd. OGL 

Alice Walker, Dec’d 4  
others by Trustee To Sun Ex- 
plor. 4  Prod. Co. OGL 

Wm B. Wright Jr. 4  
others to Ray Richey 4  Co. 
Inc (KJML

Shirley Medford Watson 
To Ray Richey 4  Co. Inc. 
OGML

Karen Yously To PHI 
Resources Ltd OGL 

William T. Yardley 4  Wife 
To PHI Resources Ltd. OGL 

Eloise Zuspann Rec. No. 
30,600 To PHI Resources 
Ltd. OGL

Eloise Zaspann Rec. No. 
30,581 To PHI Resources 
(XIL

Eliose Zuspann Rec No. 
30,572 To PHI Resources 
OGL
Instruments Filed-91it Dist. 

Court
liCland W. Carter vs Tom 

A Ferguson 4  Others 
Receivership

VIC’S WELDING & 
MUFFLER SHOPPE

», r-s
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Operating out of Houston, 
Ridgeway Oil Exploration 
and Development has driven 
stake for two 1,200-ft. 
developmental wells in the 
Hawk Eye Field, one mile 
west of Romne. The wells 
will be known as the No. 32 
and 33 Delbert Tarver “ A." 
The operation is in a 120-acre 
lease in the H4TCRR Survey 
Sec. 57 Blk. 3.

The Dead Horse Field will 
be seein g  som e m ore 
developmental action when 
SRG Oil Corp. spuds a pair of 
1,100-ft. developm en ta l 
w ells . They w ill be 
designated as the No. 6 and 
No. 7 Holt, with drillsite in a 
336-acre lease, H4TCRR 
Survey Sec. 9 Blk. 3, four 
miles northwest of Cisco.

Eastland Coutny’s Abbott 
Field saw a new gasser come 
on line when Sun Explora­
tion and Production of 
Oklahoma City completed 
the No. 13 Robertson School 
l^nd five miles southwest of 
the Strawn townsite.

On a 375-in. choke, the 
well indicated ability to 
make 298.000 CF gas per 
day. It was assigned a 
305.000 CFD rating on open 
flow.

Sun bottomed the well at 
3,806 feet and perforated the 
Marble Falls Formation for 
production 3,486 to 3,504 feet 
into the hole. The well is in a 
9,185-acre lease block, with 
drillsite in the Robertson 
CSL Survey A-4tt. ” * '  •

At a drillsite in the Foster 
Field, eight miles northwest 
of Rising Star, Trinity Ex­
ploration of Fort Worth is 
preparing to make hole for 
the No. 1 C.W. Richter. It 
will be a 4,000-ft. probe aim­
ed at either oil or gas pay in 
the Marble Falls Formation.

Snow  
OÎ1 Plaza

Pipe & Supply

Drilling Corp.

Well Service

O f (817) 629 8521

Linda Nelson
(817) 629-8123

It will be spudded in a 
100-acre lease in the Moses 
Allan Survey A-1.

The Green Show Field will 
see some more drilling ac­
tivity when Western Produc­
tion Co. of Fort Worth spuds 
its No. 1 H O. Smith “ B" 
three miles southwest of 
Romney, Eastland County. 
Projected total depth is 3,000 
feet. The operation will be in 
a 20-acre lease in the Mary 
Ann Clark Survey A-51.

Pumping at the rate of 26 
barrels of oil per day on open 
choke, the No. 11 McCall has 
been finaled in Eastland 
County’s Hawk Eye Field by 
C isco -b ased  N im rod 
Operating.

It will produce from a set 
of perforations in the Adams 
Branch Formation 1100-1106 
feet into the hole. It bottom­
ed at 1,153 feet.

Location is in a 49-acre 
lease in the G.A. McCall and 
F.M. Lasater Survey A-2004, 
two miles southwest of 
Romney.

At a location eight miles 
northeast of Cisco, Richey 
Inc. of Fort Woth has driven 
stake for  a 4,100-ft. 
developmental well in the 
R.E.B. Field. It will be 
designated as the No. 1-A 
W.H. Green. It will be spudd­
ed in a 40-acre drilling unit in 
the H-TCRR Survey A-216. It 
is aimed at either oil or gas 
production in the Marble 
Falls Formation.

Two 1,350-ft. developmen­
tal tries are scheduled by 
Dallas Energy Development 
Corp. 10 miles south of the 
Cisco city limits. The wells 
are in the C.M. O’Neal lease 
of the Midkiff Field. The 
location is in a 151-acre lease 
in the H4TCRR Survey Se. 
77 Blk. 3.

Designated as the No. 1 
and No. 2 O’Neal, the wells 
are aimed at production in 
the Adams Branch Forma­
tion.

A Palo Pinto County 
wildcat is scheduled for 
spudding three m iles 
southwest of the Santo com­
munity. It will be known as 
the No. 1-A W addel- 
Teichman. With projected 
total depth of 1,000 feet, the 
well is in a 328-acre lease 
block in Palo Pinto County’s 
T4PRR Survey.

OBK Inc. of Fort Worth is 
operator.

J.B. Davis Pipe Inc. of 
Weatherford has scheduled a 
Palo Pinto County re-entry 
operation in the McLish- 
Stone Field, three miles nor­
thwest of Morgan Mills.

'The well in question is the 
No. 2 J.B. Davis. It is in a 
136-acre lease in the G.W. 
Freighen Survey. With pro­
jected total drilling depth of 
3,000 feet, the well is aimed 
at production in the Con­
glomerate Formation.

A 1,900 wildcat venture for 
oil or gas is scheduled to be 
drilled in Palo Pinto Coun­
ty’s John F. Smith Survey, 
with Steve Warren and 
Associates Inc. of Arlington 
as the operator. Drillsite will 
be in a 258-acre lease about 
2.5 m iles  east o f the 
Pickwick community.

The well will be designated 
as the No, 4-G L,L. Bridges.

’The No. 2 Robertson-Allar 
is ready for spudding in the 
Stephens Regular Field, 
with Eldorado Oil and Gas 
Inc. of D allas as the 
operator.

Location is in a 160-acre 
unit in Stephens County's 
TE8tL Survey, three miles
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southeast of the Crystal 
Falls townsite. The well is 
aimed at either oil or gas 
production. Projected total 
depth is 4,500 feet.

Graham-based Ray Herr­
ing has posted initial poten­
tial figures for a new pro­
ducer in the Stephens 
Regular Field 10 miles south 
of Breckenridge.

Designated as the No. 2 
Kline, the well showed abili­
ty to pump 12 barrels of 
crude per day on open choke. 
It went to total depth of 4,261 
feet and was perforated to 
produce from an interval 
3,480 to 3,490 feet into the 
hole.

The operation is in a 
201-acre lease in the T4PRR 
Survey, Stephens County.

Snow Oil Co. of Ft. Worth 
has filed first production 
figures on two new oil wells 
in the REB Marble Falls 
Field. Drillsiet is five miles 
northwest of Eastland in 
Easland County’s H4TCRR 
Co. Survey, A-216. The 
operator has 80 acres leased.

The No. 1 Ramsey showed 
potential to pump 88 barrels 
of oil and 60,000 CF cas­
inghead gas per day on open 
choke. The well will produce 
from an interval 3,570 to 
3,586 feet into the wellbore. 
Total drilling depth was 3,930 
feet.

The No. 2 Ramsey pumped 
79 barrels of oil and 120,000 
CF casinghead gas per day 
« i  open choke. Bottomed at 
3,920 feet, the well will pro­
duce from perforations 3,554 
to 3,472 feet into the hole.

At a location four miles 
northeast of Cisco, Katlaco 
Operating Inc. of Lubbock 
has finaled a new wildcat oil 
producer in Eastland Coun­
ty.

The well is designated as 
the No. 4 Katlaco Fee "D ” , 
flowing oil at the rate of 63 
barrels per day on a 18/64 
choke. Tubing pressure 
came in at 325 PSI. The well 
also showed potential for 
385,000 CF of casinghead gas

per day.
Ixyjation is in a 40-acre 

lease in the H4TCRR Co. 
Survey, Sec. 65, Blk, 4. Bot­
tomed at 4,015 feet, the well 
will produce from perfora­
tions 3,406 to 3,460 feet into 
the hole.

Commission Reports 
Gas Discoveries Up

R ailroad  C om m ission  
Chairman Mack Wallace has 
announced  that Texas 
operators reported 111 gas 
and 67 oil discoveries in July 
1983.

In the same month a year 
ago, 141 gas and 51 oil 
discoveries were filed with 
the state’s energy regulatory 
agency. So far this year, 
there have been 497 oil and 
780 gas discoveries reported 
to the Commission. There 
were 368 oil discoveries and 
871 gas discoveries to date in 
1982.

Gas discoveries in July in­
cluded 29 in deep South 
Texas, 28 in the Refugio 
area, 16 in Southeast Texas, 
14 in West Central Texs, 11 in 
East Texas, six in the San 
Antonio area, two each in 
North Texas, the Panhandle, 
and the San Angelo area, and 
one in the Midland area.

Oil discoveries included 17 
in deep South Texas, 15 in

Southeast Texas, eight each 
in the Midland and Refugio 
areas, six in East Texas, five 
each in West Central Texas 
and North Texas, two in the 
Panhandle, and one in the 
Lubbock area.

In Ju ly , o p era tors  
reported 320 exploratory and 
field tests wound up as dry 
holes.

New applications for per­
mits to drill oil and gas tests 
totaled 2,826 in July, as com­
pared to 2,245 during the 
same month a year ago. So 
far this year, there have 
been 17,673 such tests com­
pared to 17,794 to date a year 
ago.

A pplications to d rill, 
deepen, plug back and for 
s e rv ice  w ells in July 
amounted to 3,204 against 
3,166 in the same month a 
year earlier. To date, there 
have been 20,286 similar ap­
plications, while to date a 
year ago there were 20,093.
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DRILLING WAS completed Wednesday afternoon In the Thomas C. Canan No. 2 Cisco 
Junior College, an oil test back of the cafeteria on College Hill. The drilling equipment was 
moved off Thursday and pipe was cemented to a round 4,000 feet as tests indicated good 
prospects for a producer. Tlie company’s No. 1CJC is producing gas and a small amount 
of oU below College Hill toward the lake.

Dr. Norman Wallace, CJC president, reported that the college received $10,000 for a 
lease on the property plus |1,S00 for each drilling site and $500 for a tank battery site -  a 
total of $13,500. Royalty checks will be coming soon, he added. (Staff Photo)

CJC Preparing For Fall Semester O school hniMnni1

Classified Ads Get Results
r

Cisco Junior College is mck- 
ing preparations to begin its 
1983 fall semester. All enter- 
ii^ freshmen attending the 
Cisco campus are to attend 
Freshm an Orientationat 
9:(X) a.m. on Monday, August 
29. Orientation will continue 
on August 30 at 9:30 a.m. In­
dividual conferences with

Season Tickets 
Placed On Sale

Season tickets for Cisco 
High School home football 
games are on sale at the 
downtown school office and 
may be purchased by those 
holding the seats last year 
through September 8, the 
day before the first home 
game. The tickets are $13 
each.

Home gam es will be 
p layed with H askell, 
Septem ber 9; B aird , 
September 30; Anson, Oc­
tober 14; Elastland, October 
20; and Jim Ned, November 
4. The September 30th game 
is the annual homecoming 
event.

The L oboes went to 
Brownwood Friday to meet 
Ballinger in a controlled 
scrimmage at 6 p.m. They go 
to De Leon September 2 to 
open the 1983 season in an 8 
p.m. game.

School Enrolls 
937 Students

Enrollment for the 198344 
school year totalled 937 
students as the fall semester 
began last Monday, Supt. 
James Couch report^. This 
was 20 less than the total for 
the last day of the 1982-83 
year.

High school enrollment 
amounted to 261 students. 
Classes were as follows: 9th 
grade 78 ,10th grade 66,11th 
grade 62, and 12th grade 55.

Junior high enrollment 
was reported as follows: 7th 
grade 86 and 8th grade 68.

Intermediate School had a 
student count as follows: 4th 
grade 71, 5th grade 72 and 
6th grade 78.

At Primary School, enroll­
m ent figu res  w ere as 
follows; kindergarten 75,1st 
grade 72, 2nd grade 83 and 
3rd grade 71.

i h  m o i i
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CISCO JUNIOR 
COLLEGE

STATE-SUPPORTED
ACADEMIC AND VOCATIONAL PROGRAMS

Y O U  CAN A F F O R D  A 
C O L L E G E  E D U C A T I O N

C O M M U T E  T O  
CI SC O J U N I O R  C O L L E G E

FRESHMAN ORIENTATION ON; 
AUGUST 29 AND 30

FALL REGISTRATION ON CISCO CAMPUS: 
AUGUST 31 AND SEPTEMBER 1 

9:00A .M , -4 :0 0  P.M.
6:00 P .M .-8:00 P.M.

FOR FULL INFORMATION CALL: 
CISCO (817) 442-2567

faculty advisors will be 
scheduled for each student.

All returning sophmores 
should see their advisor on 
August 30 to have their 
schedules approved, if they 
have not done so earlier. Ap­
proval from the faculty ad­
visor will be needed to 
register.

Registration for the fall 
semester at the Cisco cam­
pus will be held in the Stu­
dent Union Building from 
9:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon and 
1:00 to 4:00 p.m. on Wednes­
day, August 31 and Thurs­
day, September 1. Night 
Registration will be held on 
Wednesday, August 31 from 
6:00 to 8:00 p.m.

Registration is assigned 
by last name. It is important

that you register at the 
assigned time.
Last Name Time

Wednesday, August 31 
A&B 9 a.m. to 16 a.m.
C&D 10 a.m. to 11a.m.
E & F  11a.m. to 12 noon
G&H 1p.m. to 2 p.m.
lA J  2 p.m. to3 p.m.
K& L 3 p.m. to 4 p.m.

Thursday, September 1 
McMAN 9 a.m. to 10 a.m. 
0 /P A Q  10 a.m. to 11 a.m. 
R&S 11 a.m. to 12 noon
T&U 1p.m. to2 p.m.
V&W 2 p.m. to 3 p.m.
XYZ 3 p.m. to 4 p.m.

Dormitories will open at 
2:00 p.m. on Sunday, August 
28. The cafeteria will open at 
7:00 a.m. on August 29. 

C lasses w ill begin

September 2 at all locations. 
L«te registration will con­
tinue through September 15 
during regular office hours 
at the Registrar's office on 
the Cisco campus.

Students w ishing to 
register at the Clyde and 
Abilene centers may do so 
August 23 and 24, from 9:00 
a.m. to 4:00 p.m. and 6:00 to 
8:00 p.m. at the Clyde 
E du cation al C enter in 
downtown Gyde and at the 
Abilene Center in Westgate 
Mall.

For more information, call 
the appropriate campus at 
one of the fo llow in g  
num bers: C isco  (817) 
442-2567; C lyde (915) 
893-5876; Abilene (915) 
698-2212.

Are Local Public Schools 
Considered War Zones?

By WANDA HALLMARK
An article in an area 

newspaper recently printed 
a story about “ teacher bur­
nout” . A former teacher 
from Lufkin, Texas, who 
taught school for 16 years, 
ended his career and had to 
stay in the hospital for five 
months.

He was quoted as saying, 
“ Teaching has definitely 
changed in the last six years. 
The classroom is a war zone 
now."

What about our public 
shools? Are they considered 
“ war zones” ? In an inter­
view with Mr. Mike Turner, 
principal of Cisco High 
School, we found out what 
his reaction was to this state­
ment.

“ No! They are definitely 
not a war zone. I want kids to 
have a climate to learn and 
have fun, but mainly to 
learn. The teachers are h^re 
to teach, but if a problem 
arises then we will visit with 
the student and try to work 
things out.”

He said that a lot of the 
problem in Lufkin is the size 
of the school. They have 
around 2,000 students in high 
schools there. Here in Cisco, 
the teach ers  and ad­
m in istra tors  know the
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students as individuals. And 
in a lot of cases they know 
the parents. Values are dif­
ferent in a small town and a 
lot of the students live on 
farms. Small town ideas are 
different from larger cities.

“ Communication between 
p arents, students and 
teachers play a big part in 
our school system,”  Mr. 
Turner said. “ When I lived 
in Mesquite, I never saw 
anyone I knew in the grocery 
store. Here in (Tisco, it is dif­
ferent. This is a closer com­
munity.”

He said that teaching has 
definitely changed over the 
last few years. “ There is 
more interference in school 
programs now from the 
state.

“ Students have naturally 
changed, because the world 
has changed. This is the 
computer age and the space 
age, and their values have 
changed.

“ The divorce rate plays a 
major part in a child’s school 
work. If his or her parents 
get a divorce, it will affect 
their learning ability for a 
while.”

I a ^ ed  Mr. Turner if he 
ever knew of any teacher 
that had “ teacher burnout".
He said, ‘T ve  never had a 
tea ch er tell me that. 
Teachers are a special breed 
of people. They have to be

The Oteo Prats

willing to put up with the 
good days when they get 
along with students and the 
bad days when they do not.

“ I've always said that 
when a teacher reaches the 
Pearly Gates’ , the angels 

will say ‘Come on in.’
“ Teaching is a helping 

profession. They have to 
have four years of college 
and a lot (rf teachers have 
Master Degrees. They play a 
big role in our lives, although 
a lot of people don’t realize it 
until they’re older. Students 
want guidance and direction 
and a teacher has to be able 
to give them this.”

When asked if parents are 
more, or less, involved with 
their children’s school ac­
tivities, he said, “ There is a 
little more involvement in 
the elementary schools than 
in the high school. When 
children get older they 
become more independent. 
This is normal. It is an em­
barrassment to older kids 
for parents to be too involv­
ed.”

He continued, “ The best 
discipline is for a parent to 
go to school and attend each 
class with their child. Most 
kids don’t want this and they 
will behave better, if they
think this will happen.**

“ I want this school to be a 
safe place for students to 
come to and enjoy,”  state 
Mr. Turner.

Sunday.
August 28, 1983

20% OFF
All Klts-Candlewicking, String Art, Rub-N-Etch, 
Christmas Elmbroidery
PalBts-Wet Paints, Paint Pens, Dry Tempera, Acrylic 
Sets, Puff Paints
Personallsliig Items-Cans and Jars
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Eastland 
County

Residents
You Are Cordially 

Invited

To Attend the

GREATER MOGti VAIN
O P PENTECOSTAL

(U.P.C.)

From the Pastor...

I invite you to join us in worship this year. Join the multitudes of 
people who come through our doors week after week finding 
peace, joy, and the answer to the problems that life presents. A 
church that believes in miracles, divine healing, the baptism of 
the Holy Spirit, and exaults JESUS AS THE MIGHTY GOD.

^  It is “ old fashioned religion” in all modem facilities! Gospel sing- 
ing is featured each week. With our two preaching services on 
Sunday, Bible Study on Wednesday night, and Friday Family 
Night, your family will be blessed.

(10 BlUat So. of Glfco on Bwy. 1S3)
P.O.Box269817/442-2673
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The following menu for 
Cisco Prim ary and In­
termediate School students 
is for the week of August 
29-September 2.

MONDAY; B reak fast- 
cereal, orange juice, milk. 
Lunch-weiners with cheese, 
com on cob, baked beans, 
roll, cherry cobbler, milk.

TUESDAY: Breakfast- 
eggs, toast, apple, juice, 
milk. Lunch-pinto beans, 
fren ch  fr ie s , p eaches, 
cookies, combread.

W E D N E S D A Y :  
Breakfast-oatmeal, bacon, 
raisins, milk. Lunch-steak 
sandwich, bun, tossed salad, 
tator tots, milk, jello and 
bananas.

THURSDAY: Breakfast- 
french toast, juice, milk. 
L u n ch -ch ick en  patties, 
mashed potatoes, gravy, 
english peas, milk, plain 
cake, sliced bread.

FR ID A Y : B re a k fa st - 
buttered rice, cranberry 
juice, milk. Lunch-fish, cat­
sup, cole slaw, macaroni and 
cheese, applesauce, milk, 
roll.

The following menu for 
Cisco Junior-Senior High 
School students is for the 
week of August 
29-September 2.

MONDAY; B reak fast- 
cereal, orange juice, milk. 
lAinch-weiners and cheese, 
pinto beans, com on cob, cor- 
nbread, cherry cobbler, milk 
or tea. Snack bar-burritoes, 
hamburger, tuna fish, french 
fries.

TUESDAY: Breakfast- 
scrambled eggs, toast, apple 
juice, milk. Lunch-spaghetti 
and meat, english peas, 
peaches, sliced  bread, 
cookies, milk or tea. Snack 
bar-corn dog, hot dog, chili 
bun, nachoes.

W E D N E S D A Y  • 
Breakfast-oatmeal, bacon, 
raisins, milk. Lunch-steak 
sandwich, tossed salad, milk 
or tea, tator tots, jello and 
bananas. Snack b a r -  
hamburger, bar-b-q, bur- 
ritoes, pimento cheese.

THURSDAY; Breakfast- 
french toast, fruit juice, 
milk. Lunch-chicken pattie, 
gravy, whipped potatoes, 
green beans, s lic^  bread, 
cake, milk or tea. Snack bar- 
-burritoes, chili bun, hot dog, 
frito pie.

F R ID A Y ; B re a k fa st - 
huttered rice , sausage, 
cran berry  ju ice , m ilk. 
Lunch-W peanut butter, Vk 
pimento cheese, vegetable 
soup, 4  orange, crackers, 
tea or milk. Snack bar- 
hamburger, bar-b-q, steak 
sandwich, nachoes.

CJC Releases 
1983 FootbaU 
Schedule

The Athletic Department 
of Cisco Junior College has 
released  the fo llow in g 
schedule for the 1983 season: 
1983 WRANGLER FOOT­

BALL SCHEDULE 
Saturday, Sept. 3, 

McMurry at Abilene, 7:30.
Saturday, Sept. 10, Tyler 

Jr. College at iVler, 7:30.
Saturday, Sept. 17, 

Henderson County at Cisco, 
7:30.

T hursday, Sept. 22, 
Tarleton State "J V ”  at 
Cisco, 7:30

Thursday, Sept. 29, Texas 
Tech ” JV”  at Lubbock, 7:30.

Friday, Oct. 7, West Texas 
State “ JV”  at Canyon, 2:00.

Thursday, Oct. 13, Texas 
A8iM “ JV”  at CoUege SU- 
tion, 7:30.

Saturday, Oct. 22, Ranger 
Junior C ollege at 
Breckenndge, 7:30 (Lion’s 
Benefit Bowl).

Saturday, Oct. 29, Baptist 
Christian College at Cisco, 
2:00 (Homecoming).

Saturday, Nov. 5, Nor­
theastern Oklahoma at 
Miami, Oklahoma, 7:30.

Places 4th
At the first annual men’s 

slowpitch softball tourna­
ment in Elaatland, a C3aco 
team won the fourth place 
trophy. Two weeks ago the 
Ĉ iaco team won 3rd place at 
Carbon during their first an­
nual slowpitch tournament. 
Friday, Saturday and Sun­
day, August 26-28 the team 
played the “ Ranger Wredi- 
Ing O ew ”  at a tournament 
in Ranger.

Members of the team are 
Larry Pence, Ronnie Pence, 
Bobby P en ce , E lm er 
Escovedo, Joe Bdb Moore, 
Mike G eorge , Jam es 
Whitehead, Roes Escovedo, 
Tommy Jimenes, Royce 
Miller, Femle JarmiUo and 
Duane Walkingstidi.

'Hieir tropiiy will be on 
display at the First National 
Bank in Ciaco.

rv-’ . -v '.r.
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Police Investigate Two 
Offenses & 9 Incidents

Cisco police officers in­
vestigated two offenses and 
nine incidents here during 
the past week, according to 
Police Chief Billy Rains.

The offenses were two 
thefts, one at l&OO Bullard on 
August 19th and the other at 
1603 Prim rose Lane on 
August 20th. The first theft 
involved a tool box and tools 
taken from Robert Leroy 
Wilson's vehicle. It was 
valued at $500. In the second 
theft report, Gerald Parks 
advised police that someone 
had removed the battery 
from his vehicle.

Both offenses are under m- 
vestigation.

Incidents reported includ­

ed a suspicious vehicle at the 
Spot Restaurant on August 
20th at 6:30 a.m. Upon in­
vestigation, officers learned 
the subject was waiting for 
the restaurant to open.

On August 21, a reckless 
driver was reported at 1212 
Front Street by Melvin Ral­
ly. Officers secured a license 
plate lost from the vehicle 
and took pictures of damage 
caused. The damage was 
estimated as $50 to the yard 
and $25 for a tree which was 
run over, making a total of 
$75.

Subjects throwing rocks at 
vehicles at the intersection 
of 8th Street and Avenue A 
was reported at 9 p.m. on

Carp Tourney 
Set At Lake Cisco

Due to great response 
from the last tournament, 
and to help rid I.ake Cisco of 
Its rough fish, Cisco Pipe and 
EnRe Corporation are spon­
soring another 24-hour Carp 
Tournament to be held at 
lake Cisco.

The tournament starts at 
3 00 p m Saturday, August 
27 Weigh-in will be at 3 00 
p.m. Sunday, August 21 at 
the point at lake Cisco. En­
trants may fish anywhere on 
the lake They may use live 
bait or dough bait.

There is a $5 entry fee and

an optional $1 Calcutta fee.
There will be three place 

winners 50% for 1st place, 
30% for 2nd place and 20% 
for 3rd place. On the Calcut­
ta entry, big fish Lakes all.

Entries close at noon 
Saturday, August 27. Entry 
can be obtained at Mary's 
Fishing Hole inside EnRe 
C orporation  build ing , 
located across the street 
from the White Elephant 
Restaurant.

There will be an estimated 
75 to 100 entries for this tour­
nament.

i  CARLENE S D Ei'okTTW G 
SERVICE

I will bake special occasion cakes & cookies. 
Specializing in wedding, birthday, and anniver-i > 

; >ary cakes. If you need special cut out cookiesj 
; land cup cakes for school parties call 639-2287, in|
; Carbon.

August 21. Officers also 
handled a civil dispute and 
prowler report during the 
week.

A suspicious person was 
reported at Allsup's Conve­
nience Store but when of­
ficers checked on it, he was 
reported not to be causmg 
any trouble. After officers 
talked to him, he left the 
store.

On August 22, a trespass­
ing report was made by 
Mary Ann Williams at 209 
Franklin. She reported that 
she was m the process of 
moving from the residence 
when four black subjects, 
two male and two female, 
were seen entering her house 
and looking around. She was 
afraid they might come back 
and take some of her posses­
sions. Officers kept a watch 
on the residence and the sub­
jects did not return.

Another tresp assin g  
report was made at 1503 
Hickory on August 23, when 
a juvenile subject was 
reported riding a go-kart 
across Mrs. Slaughter's pro­
perty. Officers talked to the 
subject and he said he would 
not ride across the property 
again.

A reckless driver report 
was made at 1206 E. 18th by 
Mary Lou Pitchford and she 
advised officers of a subject 
driving a 1979 Chevrolet four 
door, who was spinning out 
and throwing rocks in front 
of her house. Officers talked 
to the subject and he said he 
would stop.

I 1 f
Bonnie Owens Jones

Bonnie Jone§
I§ Awarded 
Fellow§hip

Bonnie Owens Jones has 
been awarded an interna­
tional teaching fellowship to 
Victoria Australia. She will 
depart for her assignment in 
January 1964.

Ms. Jones is the twin sister 
of Donnie P etree  and 
daughter of Velma Owens 
both long-time residents of 
Cisco.

Ms. Jones has taught 
school in Texas, New Mexico 
and California. Her teaching 
experience has been in 
kmdergarten, second, fourth 
and fifth  grad es . She 
presently is teaching second 
grade at Dowling Elemen­
tary in Odessa, Texas.

She and her son, Greg, 
were recently in Cisco to at­
tend a family reunion held at 
the American I.egion Hall.

WhenOuriyees 
I Go Down In Flames, 

Our Dollars Go 
Up In Smoke.

THE
BALLET
STUDIO

BINGO
FRIDAY -T 7 p.m.

Jackpot This Week • 2 6 5 . 
Play 10 Games For $1 

Play All Night For Only $5

AMERICAN 
LEGION HALL
UcanM No 30006843090-41001 

2 blocks south of the bank 
___________Moran, Texas_________

Announcing Registration 
for Fall Classes

BALLET &  TAP
Pre-school to Teens 

Wed. Aug. 24 and Aug. 31
3:30-5:30 at the Studio 

200 E. 6th Cisco
For information or pre-registration 

call... Becky Payne 559-8443

K & E Motor And Garage
707 Ave. F. Cisco

All Kind Of Mechanic Work.
Exchange Motors & Transmissions.

Oil Changes & Tune Ups.Ha
a

M ■
■ T "

*
* A

. ' r - ■ * .̂ .

• r  1 'i -
• ,n

- V

Open 8 To 5 Mon. thru Sat.

442-4053 442-1807 Nichts

Judy’s Country Comer
New Hours:

Wednesday thru Satruday 10:00-5:00
413 Conrad HUton 442-4052

Silk Football Mums-CJC and CHS ORDEJI 
BET'ORE SEJPT' I and Recieve \0 %  Discount

LAST ALL SEASON 
VERY FULL 

LOTS OF RIBBONS
Bring this ad in with you before 
September 1 and recieve a 20%
Discount#Two Sizes to Choose from. ^

Drop By and See Our Display.

byD. 4. HERDA  
AaMrlMi*s Bast Read 
Syudlaatad PlHxto 
Cohuudst

New Gra for 3*D

I like three-dimensional photography. I think it's cute. 
I've never really taken it seriously as an art form. Indeed, 
how can something that requires the wearing of flimsy 
paper or plastic glasses to be seen be taken seriously as 
anything?

At least, that's how I felt until recently. What changed 
my mind? A 15-minute film currently playing in a 6iX)- 
seat theater in Orlando, Florida.

I'm talking about a delightful little film showing in the 
Magic Eye Theater of the Journey Into Imagination 
pavilion at Epcot Center, the newest dimension of Walt 
Disney World. Yes.it's 3-D; and. yes. you have to wear 
flimsy plastic glasses to see it. But it's a film of nnajor 
consequence, and I predict that within a very short time, 
more pieople will have seen and enjoyed it than have 
seen Star Wars, E .T., and The Empire Strikes Back 
combined.

The film, entitled Magic Journeys, was created by 
Walt Disney Productions in cooperation with Eastman 
Kodak research scientists. It was written and directed by 
academy award-winner, Murray Lemer, and scored by 
Richard and Robert Sherman, who also scored the 
movie, Mary Poppins, and 26 additional Disney films.

To  create the film, Kodak scientists conducted exten­
sive psycho-physical research to develop criteria for 
multi-dimensional projection synchronization. Using 
side-by-side projection with overlap, the fast-paced pro­
gram is shown on a 30 X 58-foot screen. The movie 
opens with a bird's-eye view of blossoming apple trees, 
followed by a boy picking a dandelion puff and blowing 
the spores, which appear to dust the audience and have 
viewers reaching out to "catch" them.

As the child's imagination takes the audience around 
the world to circuses, sphinxes, and exotic landscapes, 
objects seem to leap from the screen. In one Halloween 
scene, bolts of lightning appear to flash out into the thea­
ter.

The three-dimensional effect is created by filming 
with two cameras whose lenses are optically positioned 
at approximately 2'/? inches apart (the average space 
between human eyes). Tw o projectors are used in the 
theater, and the dual images are projected on top of 
each other.

The  neutral polarizing lenses in glasses worn by the 
audience combine the two images into a single visual 
impression with dramatic depth and realism. The im­
ages appear to be floating in the air between the screen 
and the viewer and give such a deep dimensional feel-

ing, it seems impossible not to be able to reach out and 
touch them.

Lerner used an entirely new Disney system for 3 -D  
with nearly perfect pin registration. Part of it involved 
specially designed and constructed "rigs” which allows 
pairs of cameras to be moved closer togther or farther 
apart while both remaining aimed at the same point. 
Several unique rigs for different filming situations, in­
cluding one for helicopter use, were specially built by 
Disney.

Magic Journeys establishes several firsts: the first 
combination of computer-generated animation with live 
action in 3-D; the first use of matte shots in 3-D; and the 
first use of blue screen in 3 -D  Filming took place 
throughout the U S. and undenivater in Grand Cayman, 
and the total film production took more than a year. In 
some scenes, an extraordinary amount of lighting was 
needed —  up to 30 times the normal photographic re­
quirement —  in order to take advantage of the extra di­
mension of depth in 3-D.

It's a cinch that Magic Journeys will never play in a 
theater near you. But it’s a film that’s bound to entertain, 
delight, and stimulate you. It may, in tact, change your 
entire perspective . . .  rrol only of 3-D  photography, but 
of life in general. If there’s any way whatsoever you can 
get to see it, do so.

An Egyptian desert scene is re­
created in a Disney studio and filmed 
in spectacular 3-D for a scene in 
Magic Journeys, a 70mm motion pic­
ture featured at the Kodak Journey

CLASSIFIED ADS 
a supermarket 
for everything;

B i e  O f  C O  F r o s t
S u nd o y,

A u g u s t  2 8 , 1983

Into Imagination 
Center.

_________________________

pavilion at Epcot

M a r v a l l e e ’ s  D r e s s  Shop 
; Anniversary Sale :

Open 9-5:30 Our 6th Year In Cisco Open 9-5:00
! Free S25 Gift 
J Certificate To 
Be Given Away 
1 Aug. 27th at 
; 4 P M .
* Sidewalk Sale 

Aug. 27th

B r a x t o n  &  

A c t io n  W e s t

Stretch
Jeans

» 1 2 ’ »

Nurses
Uniforms

P a n t s u it s

• 2 1 . 9 5
D re s s e s

• 1 5 . 9 5

Maternity <
P a n t s

• 8 . 9 5  ;
(

T o p s  *

• 6 . 9 5

Girls Tops

$ 6 ’ s
>
<
* S iz e  7 -1 4  
\ V a lu e s  T ’o  *19**

1 Pair Free 
Panty Hose 
With Each

$ 3 0 ^

Purchase

AU
Lingerie

3 0 %

o f f  R e g u l a r  P r ic e

Summer ! 

Skirts
•7’® to

•  1 1 9 ®

Summer All Shorts Knit Knit
' Dresses • 2 ’ ® &  ’ S ’ * Pants Tops

* 1 2 ’ ®

Short Sets •595 * 5 0 0 * 3 ’ s

V a lu e s  T o  • 1 7 ’ « S iz e  6 - 4 6
<

<

>
► New Fall Arrivals <

<
__  ^

Layaway For Back To School
; Velour Tops • ? ’ • Fall Dresses
: Corduroy Jeans •20’ » to *24’»

" ^

*12’® to *15’» Long Sleeve Blouses
; Sweater Vest * 7 ^

• 1 2 ’ »  to *16’» :
TTsrr-. ' :----- --- aa

’ Skirts *10’ » to *16’» Corduroy Blazers •26’* !

i
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f . A u t o m o t i v e  S e rv ie * I I .  B u l l  nest S e rvie * as. A n t i q u e s 34. W a n t e d  to  B u y 4b. Houses l o r  Sal* 4S. M o b il*  H om es f  0. F o r m s  U  Bo u c h e * fo .  F o r m s  U  B o a c h e *

STEVE’S GARAGE 
Ranger, Texas 

647-1651

Used Transmis.<‘ 
starters and alternators

Top dollar for wrecked 
and/or juck cars 
TC

COMPLEIE AUTO 
SERVICE

...qualified mechanic on 
duty
...Transmission repair 
...air conditioner ser­
vice
...Lubrication-polish-G- 
ulf tires
...Tire Distributor 
ROAD SERVICE 
PICKUP A DELIVERY 
Int. 20 at Carbon Hwy. 

629-8894
R U B E N ’ S IN­
TERSTATE GULF TC

11. Business S e r v ic e

STAFF ROAD FIX IT 
SHOP. We fix all small 
gaso lin e  m otors, lawn 
mowers, tillers, boat motors, 
and all small electric ap­
pliances. Phone 629-2743, RW 
Kleiner We pick up and 
deliver. T-77

OFFICE house, cleaning. 
Light handym an work, 
references available. Call 
442-1302, Cisco T69

«

JAX ELECTRIC SERVICE 
.Residential-Com m ercial; 
Rewiring; New Installations 
for service; Breaker panels; 
Washer-drier circuits; A/C; 
ceiling fans; etc. Call Jack 
Taylor. 647-5,390.

MARY KAY COSMETICS 
Patricia Gohlke 

Beauty Consultant 
647-1411 or 647-1155

I TC

McCOY CONSTRUC­
TION

COMPANY 
Add on’s 

Remodeling &
New Construction 

Houses, Storage, Sheds 
etc...

Free Estimates 
647-5344

r- n
RCG LEASING INC. 

HOME CARE
MEDICAL

Equipment & Supplies 
Southside of Square 

Flastland 629-8052

Buy or Rent Walkers, 
Wheelchairs, Hospital 
beds. Oxygen, etc. 

(Medicare Approved) 
Free Delivery

M.H. PERRY 
Southland IJfe Ins. Co. 

offers protection 
•Life «Cancer 

•Hospitalization 
•Group Plans 

•Accident/Sickness 
104 N. I.amar -  629-1566 

Evening»: 629-1095

Hearing Aid Batteries - 
Mercury 12.75 pkg. Air 
cell 13.00. CUnton Hear­
ing Aid Center, 114 W. 
8th, 442-2168, Cisco, p-73

WE CARE ABOUT 
YOUR HEALTH 

Specialising in physical 
ailments related to the 
spine and nervous 
system.

Dr. Geo. G. McPhaul 
Chiropractor 

Telephone 647-3821 
4M Pine Street Ranger 
Please CUp ^  Save. TC

Eastland Business Ser­
vices

Complete Income Tax 
Service and Accounting 
Call 629-1061 or 629-1644

WALLPAPER 
Beil Draperies 

Eastland 
629-1319

1706 W. Commerce

AVON
646-3934

IX .  A u c t i o n s

( Al l. t'S FIRST 
lor all aiK-lioB seeds: 
TICKKR AUCTION ™

HI. I Bos M i':astlsDd. TX 7M4I 
II7-«ZM»M 

Call Colkct
CoosiKompat sale Sad Sat. of 

rarh moolh 7:00 p.m. T('

14. F i n a n c i a M n s u r a n c e

WE BUY first lien notes. 
445-3404 L H. or lx>nnie 
Jones T76

BUDDY AARON  
INSURANCE

Talk to us about

35% diviations

Home-owners "B " 
Farm & Ranch 

Owner "B "

and also osk about

Farm Equipment 
Special Rates 

Broad-Form 
Coverage 

on Commerciol 
Properties

629-8533 
P.O. Box 392 
108 S. Seaman 
Eastlond, TX

X3 . L iv e s t o c k  U  Feta

FOR SALE: Saint Gertrudas 
Bull. 3 year old King Ranch 
Stock - super bull. Call C.A. 
Dawson (817) 647-1492. TC

FOR SA LE : R eg istered  
Bassett Hound puppies. Call 
629-1106 after 5 p.m. T70
.̂■VVVVVb'V .̂VVWVWMVWVP

$ FOR SALE: Brangus 
^ Bulls. 647-1182 
i  647-1155. TF
5

or

ZS. BulldInK Suppllea

BUILDING MATERIALS 
FOR SA LE : Lum ber, 
plywood, siding, moulding 
and much more. Visit our 
sales office for prices. Hours 
8 a.m. to 4 p.m. Mon. thru 
Fri. Open Saturdays 9 a.m. 
til noon. Morgan Building 
Corp. Hwy. 69 North, 
Eastland, Tx. T-tnf

l b .  F u r n i t u r e

WANT TO BUY used 
furniture. S&K Sales. 
SIS E. Main, Eastland. 
Call 629-8382 or 629-2241. 
TC

as. Antiques

srHnoiJMA!rrF.R a n t iu l e s  
ns-na

Wr will bey aee Hem *r ce 
eelale. Call 1er eppraluli. Ilenu 
1er eel* *r tpeclel llemi ye* 
wUh I* perche«*. TC

FOR SALE: ‘Antique Glass 
and Furniture’ and other col­
lectibles. ‘We buy Estates ’ 
The House of Antiques 908 S. 
Bassett, Eastlanil, Texas. 
Open every day. TF

Northview Workshop 
Wood Craft Workshop 

Wooden Gifts and Toys 
For Sale

See at 401 W. Moss 
629-2624.

l b .  M u s ic a l  I n i t r u m a n t a

FOR SALE: Alto saxaphone. 
Call 629-2700 T69

S a .M l a c .f o r  Sal*

FOR SALE: Transfer Case 
w /3 speed standard 
transmission for 4 wheel 
drive Chevrolet pickup. Call 
442-2757 after 5 weekdays. 
Anytime during weekend, tfc

WHAT A BARGAIN! Must 
sell dining-pool-game table. 
See to appreciate. Call 
629-2213 after 5:00. TF

FREE Swap shop on KVMX- 
FM 97 Radio - twice every 
Monday thru Friday at 8:30 
a.m. and 12:30 noon. Call 
629-8585 and te ll the 
Microplex what you have to 
sell, rent, give away or to an­
nounce! It’s free community 
service of KVMX-FM 97 
Radio. TF

e RADIO STATION KVMX- 
FM 97 is now Super Country 
music in stereo! Enjoy Paul 
Harvey 3 times every week­
day! * TF

DESKS, CHAIRS, files, 
safes, cash and carry. 
Save 20-50 percent. 
Large selection. 9-5:30 
weekdays. Value City 
1030 Butternut, Abilene. 

________________ T-tIc

F<)R SALE: 'Antique Glass and 
Furniture* and other collect 
tibles. ‘We buy Estates.* The 
Hoû e of Antiques moved to 9M 
S. Bassett, F^sUand, Texas 
open every day. TF

NOTICE: Doke Johnson 
Contractor-Remodeling. Con­
crete. Electrical. Plumbing, 
Fencing, Boat Dock. House 
Leveling. Call M7-3882 or 
647-3i 73. TC

FOR SALE: Card and 
gift shop affiliated with 
nationally recognized 
tradename. No fran­
chise fees. Some owner 
financing available. 
Send serious inquiries 
to: S.V.&P. 207 So. 
Lam ar, E astland , 
Texas 76448. TF

FOR SALE: Hallmark 
Store in Eastland Coun­
ty. No franchise fees. 
Some owner financing 
available. Send serious 
inquires to: S.V. and P. 
207 S. Lamar, Elastland, 
Texas 76448. TF

33 . Garage Salce

Poor Boy Resale Shop 
New & Used Merchandise 

upstairs above B&W 
Furniture 

304 Commerce St.

REPORT OH. HELD THCVES
1 - 8 0 0 - O I L - C O P S

TOLL FREE • REWARD

LARG E M O SScovered 
boulders, moss covered 
rocks, red and live oak trees, 
good building rocks. Call 
after 6 pm 915-537-2842 col­
lect Jim Carter. T-74

WANT TO BUY: Would like 
to buy an older, heavy silver 
tea and coffee service with 
tray, in good condition for 
personal use. Call 629-2413. tf

3S . H e l p  W a n t e d

BLACKWELL HOSPITAL is
accepting applications for 
registered nurses for full­
time and part-time work. RN 
work 6-12 hour shifts for two 
weeks. Pay periods and are 
paid for 80 hours. We also of­
fer sh ift d iffe ren tia l, 
mileage pay and group in­
surance. Apply in person to 
D irector of N ursing, 
Blackwell Hospital, Gor­
man, Texas. T-65tfc

NOW HIRING: Now taking 
application for LVN orGVN. 
Paid Holidays, Insurance 
available, nurses aides need­
ed for all shifts. Apply 700 S. 
Ostrom T73

PART TIME AND FULL­
TIME help wanted in pro­
gressive Community Living 
Center for mentally retarded 
adults. Apply in person, Nor­
thview Development Center, 
401 W. Moss T71

WE ARE NOW accepting ap­
plications for an RN Direc­
tor of Nurses. Benefits in­
clude paid vacation and holi­
day, medical and dental 
plana. SMck whI reUreinent 
plans available. Apply in 
person at 1405 W. Com­
merce, Eastland, Texas T72

WANTED: R.N. Director of 
Nurses for nursing home. 
Paid holidays, vacation, 
health & dental plan. Stock 
and retirem en t plan 
available. Top management 
benefits available. Aply in 
person to Judy Chaney, 700 
S. Ostrom, Eastland. T71

41. A p t .  f o r  R e n t

FOR RENT: Furnished or 
unfurnished apartments. 
Royal Oak Apartments, 1304 
Royal Lane, Cisco. Call 
442-3232. TC

APTS. FOR RENT: 1 and 2 
bedroom apts., furnished, 
water and TV cable paid. 
Fontain Apts. Cisco. Call 
442-2320 or 442-3338. TFN

FONTAIN APT.-Now 
leasin g , 1 or 2 
bedroom s. $210-6225 
month. Water and cable 
paid. 215 W. 8th, Cisco. 
915-893-5082. p-68tfc

4X. H o u t e t  l o r  R e n t

CENTURY 21-Eastco Inc. 
Several Houses for rent. 
647-1302 or 647-1635. T-tfc

4 S -R u e lr I Prop*

YARD SA LE : 200 N. 
Mulberry, Saturday, Aug. 
27, 8 a.m. til ?, deep freeze, 
antique Singer sew ing 
machine and lots of misc.T69

FOR RENT OR LEASE- 
Newly remodeled office at 
502 Conrad Hilton Ave. 1500 
Sq. ft. with central H/A, 
paneling, carpeting, drapes, 
2 baths, plus private covered 
parking, excellent location. 
629-2344 T-69

4*. H e u te *  1e r  Sal*

ONE or 2 BEDROOM 
remodeled bath and kitchen, 
new carpet & siding, storage 
building, lots of pecan trees, 
equity and take up F.H.A. 
10^ loan at $166 per month. 
Come by at 304 N. Dixie or 
call 629-8647. T72

3 BEDROOM house on 
75’xlOO’ lot. Lots of shade 
trees. One bedroom small, 
large living room carpeted, 
large kitchen, 203 S. High, 
Eastland After 5 p.m. T-70

BY OWNER: Native stone 
and brick, three bedroom, 
two baths, large gameroom, 
stone fireplace in living 
room with bookshelves and 
cathedral ceiling, near Lake 
l.«on on 44  fenced acres. 
Fenced yard, big oak trees, 
total electric, city water. 
Call 629-2449. TNF

SEVEN MOBILE homes, 
one additional apartment, on 
five fenced lots, provides 
good incom e, $37,000.00. 
Phone 647-1171 days, 647-1383 
or 647-1510 evenings. TF

f O. Farmi & Rancha*

HAY BALING HAY HAULING
Square or Lg. round Call Carl Bray

T.J. Parrish 44M447 p-7144^3674 p-$7tfc

SMALL 1 BEDROOM, 3 lots, 
lots of potentia l. Call 
647-1550. TC

VERY NICE 5 bedroom 
large living room, kitchen, 
utility room, 2 car carport. 
Prime location 4  block from 
school in quite country town 
near 4 area lakes, Strawn, 
Texas. Phone 817-672-5978 7 
pm - 10 pm. Financing 
available. T-70

BY OWNER: Energy effi­
cient, 5 mo. old, brick, 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, fireplace, 
ceiling fan, garage door 
opener, fence, many extras, 
$66,000. Call 629-2765. T-70

47.Let*fer Sal*

FOR SALE: 114 acres in 
Palo Pinto County near San­
to and Palo Pinto Lake. 
Fronts on black top county 
road, city water, and R.E.A. 
line. Ideal for development. 
$1500 per a cre . Call 
817-442-1303 after 6 p.m. 
Terms. TFC

qS. M o b i l*  H e m a a

FOR SALE: 14x65 mobile 
home, also located on a lot to 
be rented. Can be seen at 600 
S. C onnellee or ca ll 
629-3255 TF

LOTS FOR SALE: 1-2 
acre lots, edge of Cisco 
city limits, water elec- 
tricty, restricted area. 
Come and select what 
you want on our choice 
property. Survey will be 
at our expense. Call col­
lect 512-443-7413 or 
512-836-3112. P77

LAND FOR SALE: 328 acres 
at Carbon. Irrigated coastal, 
large fishing lake. Deer, 
duck and quail hunting. A 
good cattle and recreation 
place. New steel corrals. 
$700 per acre. 230 acres 3 
miles east of Flatwood Com­
munity. irrigated  from  
shallow well, new steel cor­
rals. $650 per acre. 365 acres 
3 miles southwest of DeLeon. 
Lots of deer and turkey. IV« 
miles of Sabanna River. 
Hundreds of pecan trees. Ir­
rigated coastal. Excellent 
new improvements. Large 
fishing lake. This choice 
won’t last l(Mig. $1,050 per 
acre. Terms. 200 acres half 
way between DeLeon and 
Desdemona in Erath county. 
5 irrigation wells. 80 acre 
peanut allotment. $1,150 per 
a cre . RANKIN
PROPERTIES-915-673-4226. 
BOB R A N K IN -R es:
915698-7799

m m ^ N ^ u L A ^ ^
Blown in cellulose 
Fiberglass bath 

Accoustical ceilings 
Free estimates 

817-7256683. 74-tIc

D IREa DEPOSIT. 
YOU'VE GOT IT COMING 
JUST AS MUCH AS YOUR 
GOVERNMENT PAYMENT 

ITSELF.
Sena your Social Security - or your other Government 

payments straight to your occount ana go otxiut your 
Pusmess without the Pother of oepostimg a check

The Dance Studio
Featuring:

‘̂The Janimie Dee Dancers”

ENROLL NOW!
Classes offered:

Ballet

Baton 
Aerobics 
For Ages 3 
to Adult

The Jammie Dee Dancers will

Perform in Local Parades« Civic

Organizations and Football

Games.
— B * g m - 8 e | i t . * ^ - • -*

So Enrol] Now!
To Enroll CaU 647-1308

♦-70

Business Services
Sale

Eastland Galleria 
&Gift Shoppe

^  Mid Summer Sale
Off All Inventory. 

Excluding Film & Processing 
Beginning August 8

liSbiSb. MSb.Sbi

•//* / 6 
0  ^  ' f  .

See What Mary Kay Cosmetics 
Can Do For You

Lesa Stutts 817-653-2338

CISCO HADIATOR SERVICE
207 E. 6th (Breckenridge Hwy.)

Cisco, Texas 817-442-1547

• Claanlng-Roddlng.Rqpalrlng

• Auto-Truck-Tractor Radiators

• Nqw-Rocorqd-Robuilt Radlatora-Hoatars
• Excharygq Radiators
• Auto Go* Tonks Ropolrod

Opon Mondoy-Fridoy 8:00a.m.-S:30p.m.

Ovqr 25 Yoor* Exparlanca . Rodlotors A rg  O ur Buaint*

Bookkeeping and Tax Service

Ken Parrack
205 E Main, Ranger, 647-3022 

116 North Seamon. Eastland 629-8641

INCOME TAX RETURNS 
MONTHLY AND QUARTERLY

REPORTING FOR BUSINESS
Individual. Portnership, ond Corporotion Tax Raturns

' d

Chain Link Fencing 
Commercial—Resdential—Farm 

Mobil* Horn* Set-Ups 
U nd*r pi nni ng-L*v*l i ng 

Wdding-Corrals-Carports 
Gat* Entranc*s-Smali O r Larg*

Leroy Steinman tf 647-1946

The
Pizza House

In Eutirad 
On Thn Squarn

6294838 TC 6284731

NICHOLS HOME IMPROVEMENT
• New Home, Add ons
• Concrete Walks & Drives
• Framing & Cornice Work

a Cabinets A Formica Tops 
• Paneling, Sheetrock 

a Floorcovering A Ceramic 
T i l e

o Garage Conversions a Paneling A Trim
o Screened Proches a Drywnll A Aconatic Ceilings

Complete Home Remodeling A Repalr
__________________44^3 73 7,.T^

Smalley Fence Company
647-3873

A Fence For Every Need 
Chain Link—Wood—IrKk^ial—Farm—

’ decorotiv*—Londtoop*—Wrought Iron - 
Ballparks—Tennis Courts—Oog runs 

And More ^
-  < ■ ■ ■

•••ff-SFCiC.
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Real Estate 
Consumer Property Elxchange Can Defer Taxes

David 8. Jones

THE R E AL ESTATE 
CONSUMER li provided as 
public le rv ice  by this 
Dcwspaper and the T eu s 
R eal E state R esearch  
Center. Address inquiries to: 
The Real Estate Consumer, 
Texas Real Estate Research 
Center, Texas AAM Univer­
sity, College Station, Texas 
T7U3.

As real estate values 
climb, so does the tax bite on 
property sold. Many sellers 
experience more gain on 
their property than they an­
ticipated and are shocked by 
the taxes on it.

One solution to the pro­
blem IS a tax-deferred ex­
change of property, called a 
“ 1031" by the real estate in­
dustry because it is Section 
1031 of the federal tax code 
that allows for it. The law 
permits tax-deferred ex­
changes of real estate pro­
perties as long as (hey are of 
“ like kind ”

Although fluorescent tubes 
generally cost more to in­
stall, they last as much as 12 
times as long as incandes­
cent bulbs, and they use less 
electricity-about 25 to 35 
percent less

Most rapid-start fluores­
cent lamps do not burn more 
energy when first turned on- 
as IS popularly believed-nor 
do they bum out faster due to 
frequent on-off cycles

So, learn the facts of light 
and reduce your electricity 
bill by using wise lighting 
practices in your home

do they save on four years of 
rental payments, but the 
houses generally turn out to 
be excellent investments.

Student, wU*« MM „ally find 
roommates to help pay liv­
ing expenses and mortgage 
payments. Recognizing the 
potential of this market, 
developers in Austin and Col­
lege Station are constructing 
large-scale condominium 
projects specifically for 
students.

Condominium units can be 
designed to match the 
students' need for limited 
space and proximity to cam­
pus

Such an exchange lets you 
the property owner apply the 
appreciation in one parcel of 
real estate to the price of a 
new one The owner pays 
taxes on the gam only to the 
extent that other kinds of 
property are received in the 
tran saction --su ch  as 
ycurities, notes or cash.

Be sure to discuss a 1031 
swap with your tax adviser 
before you sell your next 
piece of property

BUY A HOUSE FOR COL­
LEGE

A growing number of 
parents are combining in­
vestment in their children’s 
college education with in­
vestment in real estate.

With dormitory space and 
off-campus rental housmg 
hard to find, these parents 
are buying houses for their 
children to occupy durmg 
their college stay. Not only

AVERAGE HOME SIZE IS 
SHRINKING

The nation’s houses have 
started to shrink.

According to data from the 
1980 census, the median size 
of a house built in the United 
States last year was just less 
than 1,600 square feet. That 
IS a drop of 50 square feet 
from the 1979 median size, 
and it reverses a trend of in- 
;?reasingly larger houses

SAVE ENERGY WITH 
FLU O RESCEN T L l ^ ^  
Here’s a tip to help you 

save home energy costs You 
can cut the cost of lighting 
your home up to 75 percent 
simply by choosing and us­
ing e ffic ie n t  lighting 
systems

Fluorescent lighting is 
nearly four times as efficient 
as incandescent lighting.

Hutton Insulation
BLDWN-IIIIISULATIOII
Saves Blown UpEneriiy Bills

BLOWN IN INSUL ATI'

•Blown-in
Cellulose

•Acoustical Ceilings 
•nbhrtHass’ Butts

FREE
ESTIMATES

817-7256683 FULL THICKNESS 
WALL INSULATION

COrNTRY
90«  E •«<

C m » Tsaot 76437

REAL ESTATE

HO.« -  442-1693
2 BD. X-tra neat, remodelled insulated new siding, fireplace, shop & garage 
2 BD. large shady corner lot, minor work turns this into great older home,
2 BO, siding, built-ins laundry, bar carport Cent KA, large lot
2 BD, with formal dining, n stove 1 ' lots fenced yard
Large 2 BD home on oversized lot storm cellar, garden, carport, $19.000
3 BD 1 Bath, new kitchen, dining room carport, on quiet street, $23.500.
3 BD. 2 Bath 2 fireplaces, needs repair, large metal workshop,REASONABLY PRICED 
3 BO. rental or starter home fenced owner carry MAKE OFFER!
3 BO. corner lot. Cent HA live in the country while in town $25,000 

BD. Cent HA. comfortable home on corner, storage, garage 
BO TLC will enhance this home GREAT LO CA TIO N "
BO. on paved street spacious kitchen, carport shade trees, corner lot 
BD. 2 Bath, on 3 lots, modern kitchen bar. PRICE REDUCED TO $32.500 

BRICK 3 BD, 2 Bath, all electric, fireplace. ROYAL OAKS ADDITON. $65,000 
BRICK 3 BD. 2 Bath. 2 lots, fenced, built-ins. fireplace, corner lots.
OLD FASHIONED CHARM 3 BD. 1 Bath Brick, hardwood floors, sunporch. 2 
garage, with plenty of storage A QUALITY HOME in a FINE NEIGHBORHOOD' 
Mobile 3 BD. 2 Bath, built on living room and storage, corner $15.500 
PUTNAM  - Partially remodelled. 2 fireplaces, 2 lots, garden spot, $15.500 

LOTS & ACtCAGE

73 AC. 3 BD. 2 Bath, w office, fireplace, pool many X-tra features & minerals.
22 corner lots, great for Mobile horxoiD 'lenty room cellar Make offer 
2.68 AC. fenced, out buildings, carport lovely 2 BD home with room to expand 
3 AC. 3 BD. stone, wfireplace. Cent. HA. plus 1 BD guest house 
78 AC. 2 BD. home, pasture, tank.scxo^e minerals. South of Cisco ONLY $66.300 
116 AC. CROSS PLAINS • BRICK HOME 2 Baths. Cent HA patio extra garage 
storage, wells, sheds, paved road, garden LOVELY FARM
LAKE PROPERTY

3
3
4 
4

car

Landscaped on South Lake Cisco -2 BO Mobile home with dock only $12.500 
South Side Lake Home with guest house, boat house, many extras REDUCED'! 
North Side -  Lovely home on deepwater, dock, patios, fireplace, 3 baths IDEAL 
RETREAT! Ready to move in!

Penny A. Reay 442-1707 OFFICE 442-1693 Dana Goosen, Broker 442-3958
Jeffrey Whiteside 643-3129

WE HAVE MORE LISTING S -  CALL US FOR YOUR REAL ESTATE NEEDS!

u n a n m m im n K M m t ia m t m K m a f n r m m

built each year since 1975.
Not only is the median 

house now s7T'’'!! ‘’ r, b'lt it 
also com es with fewer 
amenities, such as garages, 
fireplaces and four or more 
bedrooms. The only amenity 
to increase was central air- 
conditioning.

Despite the reduction in 
size and amenities, the cost 
of a house was still high. The 
average price nationwide 
was $76,300. Although prices 
were high, the proportion of 
owner-occupied units now 
stands at an all-time high of 
more than 65 percent.

]uires landlords to install a 
-e-key a deadbolt lock or 
chain lock on an exterior 
loor or window after the 
•esident makes a written re­
quest.

The law helps satisfy the 
resident’s need for security 
yet allows the landlord to 
maintain control of the 
lumber and type of locks in- 
italled.

Tenants who request in­
stallation of rekeying of

'ocks can be charged in ad- 
/ance for the cost of labor, 
materials and extra keys but 
lot for any profit to the 
landlord. The locks become 
1 permanent fixture of the 
rental unit and cannot be 
removed by the resident 
without written permission 
of the landlord.

Lone Star Title
& Abstract Co.

Joe B. Koonce, Mgr.
101 W . Main

Eastland. T exas 76448 
(817) 629-2683

CLASSIFIED ADS 
GET RESULTS

NEW LAW MANDATES 
LOCKS UPON REQUEST 
Life may become a little 

more secure for renters, 
hanks to a new state law 
which became effective in 
leptemeber. The law re-

New Frame Homes 
By La Data

For Immediate Move-In
2 bedroom, 1 bath, 960 sq. ft., central air and heat, carpet, 
all electric, stove w/vent-a-hood, energy efficient, 
washer/dryer connections, low taxes, 2 blocks from 
school and much more. ONLY $27,900.
We Only Build Affordable Homes 
La Data Corp.
Rt. 1 Box 38C 
Carbon, Texas
817-639-2270 ^-69

PAT MAYNARD REAL ESTATE
629-8568 EASTLAND INT. 20 E. NORTH SIDE 442-1880 CISCO

Nomss: Eastlsnd. Ronger and CoriNNi
Move in this 2 bedroom, 1 bath older brick 

home with only $1500 total down, good loca­
tion. $31,000.

In Olden, 3 bedroom, 2 bath mobil home, 
wood siding. 14x80 Art Craft, low equity, 
$28,000.

In Ranger, 3 bedroom, 2 bath stucco home 
on large lot, 2 car de-attached garage, several 
fruit trees, $25,000.

$2,000 total move in cost. Owner finance on 
this nice, large 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame 
honve. $29,500.

A beautiful 2 story br|ck home in 
OakhoUow, 4 bedrooms, 2 batbs, 2 half-baths,
3 car garage with automatic door opener, kit­
chen has center island, 2 cook tops, Jennaire 
grill, microwave, trash compactor and double 
ovens, breakfast room, formal dining and liv­
ing rooms, gameroom and den, assumable 
loan. Call for appointment.

In Olden, 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath brick home 
on 1 acre, carport, central heat/air, fruit 
trees. $57,500.00

Prestigious 2 story rock home on one of 
Eastland’s finest streets. This is an excep­
tional home with approx. 5,000 sq. ft. and has 
all the extras including CH-CA, built-ins, 
trash compactor, intercom system, stereo 
hookups in each room, 2 car garage with elec­
tric door opener, drapes, fenced yard, and 
more. Definitely a quality place. Call for ap­
pointment.

Just listed: 3 bedroom, 1 bath with ceiling 
fans, refrig, air, big oak trees and nice garden 
spot, plus a large workshop. $30,000.

Attention young couples: Good starter 
home, beats paying rent. 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
with detached garage. $18,000.

3 bedroom, 14 bath frame home on large 
lot, living/dining room area with fireplace, 
large kitchen with separage utility, 
breezeway between garage, fruit trees. 
$35,000.

3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath brick home on large 
lot. Will have new carpet, paint and other 
repairs made. Built-ins with central heat and 
air. $41,500.

3 bedroom, 1 bath 2-story frame home, 
separate living and den, large master 
bedroom and kitchen. $27,500.

A 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath brick home in the 
desirable Crestwood addition, large living 
area with fireplace, beautiful lot. $77,000.

In Ranger, a beautiful stucco 3 bedroom, 1 
bath home, detached garage, storage 
buildings. $39,000.

In Gorman, 2 bedroom 1 bath frame home 
on 24  lots with separate garage and storage. 
$30,000.

Located in Carbon: 2 bedroom home on one 
acre. Country living in town. Only $16,000.

Want a new home? We have large lots 
available in exclusive area. City water, 
sewer, and paved streets. This area is 
restricted to brick homes only. Reasonably 
priced from $4500 to $5500.

New homes in the exclusive OakhoUow 
brick home addition. Call for an appointment.

New on the market. A 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
home, formal dining area, CH-CA, carpeted, 
nice modern cabinets with dishwasher. 
$35,000

Only 9 months old, this 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 
bath brick home in exclusive area. Custom 
riiade drapes, fieplace, and other extras. 
$67,000.

A very nice 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath brick 
home, separate Uving and den. $50,500.

Large master bedroom in this 3 bedroom, 2 
bath home on one of our better streets, fur­
nished. Owner finance at 9% interest $40.000.

In Olden, we have a 2 bedroom, 1 bath older 
home that needs some repairs. Priced at 
$16,000

PAT AAAYNARD CINDYE FOSTER 
Brokar Associott

629-8063 629-8195

In Ranger, a nice 3 bedroom, 14  bath brick 
home with carpet, drapes, CH-CA, fenced 
back yard, storage building. $47,000.

SmaN Acreage WMi Homes
24  acres on Staff road near Lake Leon with 

water weU and tool house. Nice place for 
home. Only $7500.

In Carbon, 3 bedroom, 13/4 bath, rock home 
on 4 acres, ^ op , bam, fruit trees. $31,500.

A large 3 bedroom, 2 bath mobile home (14 
X 72) on 5.69 acres, located on FM 2214, with 14 
jt 10 attached greenhouse. A-frame and other 
storage buildings, city water. $43,000.

In Carbon, 9.3 acres with 3 bedroom, 14 
bath mobile home (12x65) located on Hwy. 6, 
52 pecan trees, wells, beautiful place, $35,000. 
(WiU consider small down, remainder over 10 
years at 10% interest)

Out of Cisco, 10 acres northest off of old 
Abilene Hwy, city water and electricity. 
Assumable loan. Reduced to $12,000.

Located in Ranger. A 4 bedroom, 1 bath 
frame home on 5 acres with an old motel on 
the property. Home is in good condition. All 
this for only $55,000.

S.3 acres near Lake Leon with a 2 bedroom 
mobile home (14x70). Carpeted, central 
heat/air, house type windows, special siding, 
storage building and city water. $35,000.

16 acres near Eastland, with 1-20 frontage. 
$4,000 per acre. In 4 acre tracts $4500 per acre.

Located near Union Center: 2 bf^room 1 
bath home on approx. 38 acres. This house is a 
dream place in the country. $70,000.

A 3 bedroom, 2 4  bath, 2 story, approx. 3,000 
sq. ft. brick home only 3 years old situated on 
10 acres close to Eastland. Unique petrified 
wood fireplace. $105,000.

Beautiful 3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home 
with built-ins, CH-CA ceiling fans, covered 
patio, 2 car garage plus other extras. 3 acres 
near Breckenridge. $82,000.

Forint A Ranchai
120 acres south of Cisco on 206 and 569, 2 

bedroom, 14  bath brick home, hay barn, cor­
rals, storage buildings, 2 irrigation wells and 
pipe, 11 pecan trees, 4  minerals. $136,000.

131 acres southwest of Cisco with 2 
bedroom, 14 bath frame home, cultivation 
and timber, 4 water wells, bams. Some 
m inerals. Owner financing available. 
$160,000.

40 acres off 2526 out of Carbon, nearly all in 
love grass, some minerals. $900 per acre.

A hunter’s dream, this 150 acres south of 
Clarbon. 60 acres of cultivation, good fences 
and hunters shack. $600 per acre. Owner will 
finance.

40 acres located south of Cisco on 183, native 
pasture with scattered pecan trees, one well 
and tank, fenced (3) sides. $42,000.

Near Eastland and Lake Leon, 49.6 wooded 
acres with six tanks and spring, on FJ 2214, 
good place to hunt and fish, assumable loan. 
$60,000.

Near Lake Leon, a 20 acre tract of land. 
Some cultivation and good hunting area. 
$30,000.

Need exposure, we have an attractive 70 
acres located on 1-20. Nice tanks and weekend 
cabin. See to appreciate.

320 acres located between Carbon and Gor­
man. Some cultivation but most wooded. 
Good fences and hunting, some minerals in­
cluded: $500 per acre. Owner financed at 9%.

5 acres near Eastland. 1-20 frontage. $5,000 
per acre. Terms can be arranged.

L4)cated south of Cisco, 50 acres with ap­
prox. 35 acres of pecan trees. Owner will con­
sider terms. $74,200.

248 acres located on old Abilene Hwy. west 
of Cisco, mostly cleared with some wooded 
acreage, good fences, 4  minerals with leas­
ing rights. $530 per acre.

100 acres between Lake Leon and 
Desdemona, all in cultivation and coastal. 
Good 5 wire fence and cross fence, shallow 
water, $800 per acre. Owner finance at 9%.

640 acres approx. 17 miles northwest of 
Breckenridge with 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame 
house, 175 acres cultivation with remainder in 
pasture. 45% minerals with leasing rights. 
$583 per acre.

160 acres off of Hwy. 183 eight miles south of 
Csico, 100 acres cultivation, remainder trees. 
$600 per acre.

Cisco Hones
Nice, 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath brick home in 

good neighborhood. Has CH/CA, built-ins, 
fireplace, fenced yard, double garage and 
other extras.

A large 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with formal 
dining and breakfast area. Vinyl siding, 
garage, storage building, on 24  lots with 
large oak trees.

Large 3 bedroom, 2 bath frame home with 
fireplace. Metal workshop and other 
buildings on several lots. Great potential. 
$37,500.

A 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home, double 
carport, storage building. $22,000.

2 or 3 bedroom, carpeted home with central 
heat and air. Surrounded by beautiful oak 
trees. Paved street. Also has large shop and 
garage.

Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame home. New 
carpet, large rooms. Nice trees and shrub­
bery. Owner financing available. $22,500.

A 4 bedroom, 13/4 bath 2 story stone home 
on 2 big lots; privacy fence around swimming 
pool. Also has small efficiency rental unit. 
Reduced to $29,500.

Large 2 story with 5 bedrooms, 2 baths, den, 
separate dining and breakfast rooms, located 
on 2 big comer lots. Also has a nice roomy 
apartment attached. Beautiful landscaped 
yard with lots of trees.

A new 4 bedroom, 2 bath home on .46 acre 
lot, (TH-CA, large carport and storage room, 
with fireplace and storm windows.

A 3 bedroom, 1 bath home with a small 
apartment, storage building, situated on 2 
lots. This nice home has bee reduced to 
$29,800.

WE NEED MORE CISCO LISTINGS.

Commercial
Located near downtown: an older building 

that would make a good location for a 
business. $35,000.

In Cisco, a 100’ x 50’ building with office 
space and shop area of 4400 sq. ft. Owner will 
finance this one with reasonable down pay­
ment and Interest. $75,000 for building or 
$95,000 for everything as is, as a business.

In Eastland, a new metal building, 2400 sq. 
ft. with dock area. $38,000.

In Ranger, a large 2 story brick building 
with good sized fenced yard. Located near 
railroad tracks with spur. $85,000.

Located near downtown. A 2 story brick 
building, 4 lots and a house. All this for 
$40,000. Will consider splitting.

Valuable 1-20 property. Approx. 4,600 sq. ft. 
building, very versatile, easy accessability. 
$77,500.

For commercial use only. 1 to 5 acres with 
1-20 frontage.

For Lease. 2 story brick building near 
downtown Eastland. $250 per month.

Located on Main Street, a 10,000 aq. ft. 
building. Ideal location for a business. Extra 
lots go with this one. $135,000, owner will 
finance with good terms.

WE HAVE OTHER HOMES, LAND 
COMMERCIAL LISTINGS

AND

AN N  WILLIAMS 
Aooociat» 
442-1880

WAYNE CHANDLER 
Asoociala
734-2782

WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS! 
KAY BAILEY NOLAN BUTLER 

AMOciota Asoocioti
629-2365 629-8106
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Tax Checks Sent By Bullock
AUSTIN, Tex-State Com­

ptroller Bob Bullock today 
sent checks totaling $103 
million in local sales tax 
payments to 974 cities that 
levy the one-percent sales 
tax.

“ So far this year, we are 
]ust a little ahead of 1982 
payments,”  Bullock said. 
“ This is about where we ex­
pected to he by this time 
when we put out our revenue 
estimate for the state.”

Bullock said seven of the 
20 Texas cities that collect 
the most local sales tax- 
Houston, El Paso, Beau­
mont, Odessa, A bilene, 
Midland and Tyler-continue 
to lag behind last year’s 
receipts. But the August pay­
ment to all seven showed

they had gained ground 
since last month.

Houston got the biggest 
check, $19.6 million. Dallas 
received $11.6 million. San 
A ntonio re ce iv e d  $5.8 
million, bringing the city’s 
1983 payments 9.3 percent 
above 1982 levels.

In Eastland County, Cisco 
re ce iv e d  a ch eck  for 
$25,212.88 down 9.79 percent 
from last year. Eastland was 
down 6.50 percent netting a 
ch eck  this p ero id  for 
$34,361.86. Ranger’s check 
was for $15,142.79 down 19.03 
percent.

Rising Star was the only 
city in the county not down 
over last year. Their check 
this month was $4,253.38. 
Gorman received a check for 
$3,227.54 but also showed a 
loss in percentage over last

year of minus 18.32 percent.

m e August checks were 
for taxes collected on sales 
made in June and reported 
to the Comptroller by the end 
of July.

Onlu9i-
E n z i

Eostco, Inc.
107-A Main, Rongor
Bill Griffith-Brok«r-PrM. Ea«too, Inc.

Jessell Velie Visits
Local Rebekahs

Ranger MDA 
Needs Help

Jesselee Velie, President 
of the Rebekah Assembly of 
Texas visited District 47 
w hich includes
Breckenridge, Cisco and 
Eastland. The meeting was 
held in the Rebekah Hall, 300 
N. Lam ar on Monday,

Arrie Jane Bro<^, the 
M.D.A. Coordinator for 
Ranger needs volunteers to 
help man the phones during 
the Jerry Lewis Labor Day 
Telethon on Labor Day 
Weekend. If you would like 
to help please call:
Arríe Jane Brooks 
647-3048 before 2:00 p.m. 
647-3483 after 2:00 p.m.

JESSELL VEUE

August 22, and was opend 
with a covered dish supper.

Sister Velie gave a review 
of her visit over the state of 
Texas and used the theme 
“ Busy Bees Are Happy 
Bees”  during her presenta­
tion.

Attending the meeting 
were Era Hamilton of Cisco, 
District Deputy President of 
District 47; five members of 
the Goodwill Rebekah Lodge 
of Cisco; six members and a 
guest from the Oddfellow 
and Rebekah Lodge of 
Albany; one member from 
Goosecreek Rebekah Lodge; 
the president and one 
member from the Rebekah 
Lodge of Bay Town; 14 
Eastland Rebekahs and two 
Odd Fellows.

Carpet Cleaning
Living, Dining & Hall

•WATE» EXTRACTION 
•SPOT REMOVAL 
•DEODORIZING 
•UPHOtSTERY CLEANING

•39’ *
629-2721

•AUTO INTERIORS

pr.Gary Harris
ao.s.

Announces The Opening Of His 

Office Of General Dentistry
ormer Location Of Dr. Robart F. Blockstock 

OfficR Hours 9 to 5 Mon. thru Fri.

- 602 Ave. E

Photo Club 

Sete Tue8day

KINCAID REAL ESTATE
100 S. Seom on A 9 O .1 7ft 1
Eastland, Texos 7 6 4 4 8  u a t * i # u i

Meeting
The Microplex Photo club 

will meet Tuesday, August 
30, 1983, at 7:00 p.m. in the 
Conference Room on the 
Treehouse L evel, Best 
Western Inn, Eastland.

RESIDENTIAL COMMERCIAL
Brick, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 1800 sq. ft. 
with all the extras. Exclusive area, 
$91,500.

The old Thrift Mart store on E. 80 in 
Elastland 9,000 ft. owner finance, 
possible lease with option to buy also.

All m em bers and in­
terested persons are cordial­
ly invited to attend. Discus­
sion will be held and final 
plans made concerning the 
upcomlngt'Elastland County ‘ 
Fair Competition. Also, this 
is the yearly  planning 
meeting, so come with plen­
ty of ideas and bring a 
friend.

Brick, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 1800 sq. ft. 
fenced, one acre lot, $42,000. Located in 
Olden. Some owner financing. ACREAGE
Frame, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 1800 sq. ft., 
good neighborhood.

5 acres with water meter. ^  mile out of 
Ranger. $10,000. Owner finance.

BUILD rif LIKE YOU WANT:' New 
homes to be constructed at hard to beat 
prices. Now is the time to consider new 
construction.

•I .1 >’  n . K  ( I
42.35 acres, owner finance, 
pasture land, $685.00/acre.

good

Photographer of the Month 
for July was Marti Mitchell 
of Eastland; and for August 
was Helen Wallace of Cisco. 
Carl Boustead of Eastland is 
being honored as the 
Photogrpeher of the Month 
for September. His work can 
be viewed in the lobby of the 
Best Western Inn, Eastland.

The Club is open to all per­
sons in the Microplex area - 
adults and children - in­
terested in photography.

For more information, call 
Ron Mouser at 442-3775 or 
Neal Raney at 629-2798.

Frame, NEW 2 bedroom, 1 bath, 900 sq. 
ft., 1 car garage, $38,500. Includes 
drapes, carpet, dishwasher, stove, vent 
a hood, garbage disposal and new fence 
around back yard.

1C acres located on the southwest side 
of Elastland Lake with irrigated coastal 
fields with two bedroom home and 
miscellaneous equipment. $220,000 with 
owner financing.

35 acres between Eastland and Cisco 
just off of Hwy 80 on spur with city 
water, cable tv, will split down to 5 acre 
tracts.

We hove several other listings 

If you know what you wont, coll us end let us find it for it

Robert M. Kincaid Guy Kincaid Millo Kiricoid _______
(Broker) (817) 629-1804 (817) 629-8757 '“¡JJli'SX

• f o u l l y ,  &  
Qounity

KAL ISTATE

ORSARA LOVE,
B R O K E R

INC. • HIGHWAY 0O EAST 
EASTLAND. TEXAS 764AB

629-8391 629-1725
EASTLAND

NEAR SCHOOLS-4 bdr. m  baths on 2 lots. El 
ASSUMABLE LOAN, Large 3 bdr., 2 baths. E3
FANTASTIC DEAL-2 bd, 2 B frame, Cent. H/A. E2 
ASSUME FHA No qualifying, 3 hr. 1 bath cen. H/A. E5 
CHARMING 2 STORY 4 bdr. beautifully decorated. E6 
LARGE 2 bdr., H/A, com er fenced. Assume FHA. E7 
LARGE FAMILY? 4 bdr., Ji, brick, extras. E9 
i.iKF NEW-2 bdr., br sou> ome, cent. H/A. ElO 
EXTRA NICE 2 br. home-Priced right. E ll 
BRICK 3 Br.. 14̂  bath. 2 living area, natio. E12 
LARGE LOT, 3 bdr., 1 b., frame, lots of extras. E13 
PRICED REDUCED-4 bdr, 3 bath, extras. E14 
NICE FRAME 3 bdr., m  $ou> A, Storage, Big yard. E15
NEAR SCHOOLS- older 3 bdr frame-lots storage. E16 
NICE OLDER-2 bdr., cent. H/A, new kitchen. E17 
BEGINNING UNIQUE 144 story rock In OakhoUow. E18 
ENERGY EFFICIENT new metal frame 2 bdr. home. 
NEW HOMES UNDER CONSTRUCTION. Call for details. 
CLOSE TO SCHOOLS, 3 bdr. 144 bath, nice house. E20 
PRICED RIGHT, 2 bdr., 1 bth, Inside repainted. E21 
BRICK 3 bdr., 144 ba.. Will trade for Lake Leon. E22 
OLDER 3 Bdr., Double garage, trees, Good area. E23

GORAAAN
MOBILE HOME, 3 lots. 3 bdr., 2 bath. G1
ROCK HOME, over 1 ac. lot. G3
EQUITY BUY-3 bdr., patio and storage building. G8

OTHER
CISCO-Frame, 3 bd. 1 B, garage, large lot, trees.013 
RANGER, Large 2 bdr., cellar, comer lot, nice. 01
144 STORY LAKE HOUSE, 3 bdr., 3 baths, leased lot. 02 
CISCO, 3 bdr., 1 bath on 1 Ac. Greenhouse, trees. 03 
LAKE LEON, 3 Br., 144 B., Mobile Home, good water. 04 
RISING STAR, 1900’s home needs TLC, on 8 Ac. 05 
LAKE LEON, 2 bdr. 1. sold 3 deeded lots. Boat hse. 06 
LAKE LEON, 3 bdr., 2 baths, on 2 deeded lots. 07 
OLDEN, 2-3 Br., 1 B., Lg. fenced lot, carport. 08 
RANGER ASSUMEABLE, 3 Br. 2 B. Cent. H/A extras. 09 
CISCO OWNER FINANCE, 2 Br. 244 lots. Appliances. OlO 
CARBON, 2 Br., 75% completed, you finish & SAVE. Oil 
CISCO-Brick 5 yr old 3bd, 2 bath, many extras.012 

HOUSE AND ACREAGE
OWNER FINANCED- 2 *ou> n 144 Ac.-Eastland HAl 
744 ACRES, 2 bdr. home, bunkhouse and bams. HA5 
5 AC., 2 bdr., 1 b 'loio ome in Olden. HA6 
CROSS PLAINS,116 ac., custom brick home. HAll 
CISCO, 4 bdr., 244 bath home on 10 acres. HA15

ACREAGE
Al

PfGGYE SWAFFORD 
*47-1090

HAZEL UNDERWOOD 
639-1188

428 ACRES So. of Cisco, ^soio lunting, minerals.
.725 AC. So. access of 1-20, near 2 exits. A2 
1.2 ACRES, city water, excellent homesites. A3 
SMALL tracts So. of Eastland, building sites. A4 
100 ACRES, good coastal, bams, corrals, 3 tanks. A5 
78 ACRES, Necessity Comm., 2 tanks, some minerals. A6 
lZ4ii AC. Near Lake Leon on pavement, staff water. A7 
$0 ACRES, NW of Cisco, Rd. frontage on 2 sides. A8 
18744 AC. 70 Ac. field, rest pasture, tanks, well. A14 
30.87 AC. on FMS71SE of Lake Leon, trees, minerals. A15 
RISING STAR, 8 ac., w/older home, owner carry. A17

COMMERCIAL
OFFICE BLDG, on Seaman, owner carry. Cl 
4-PLEX APTS. 2 bdr., 1 or 144 baths. FHA. C2 
3 REINTALS, large lota, fenced, garage. C3 
OFFICE BLDG., 2 lots on Commerce St. C4 
HWY 80 E. near I-2i}, large bldg. 44 ac. C5 
PRICE REDUCED-Office or ReUU, Main Street. C8 
BRECKENRIDGE, bldg, k  older sUUon on 244 lots, a  
N. SEAMAN, stucco bldg., 3 blks. from square. C8 
GORMAN-Hwy. 6 FronUge-Cafe k  MeUl Building. C9

ELMER FOSTERBARBARA LOVE ROGHI AUTREY
*47-1397 443-3345 *39-1973

IF YOU THINK 
THE POWER 

IS OFF
WHEN THE SWITCH 

IS OFF
YOU'RE WRONG.

6 4 7 - 1 3 0 2lATft loC mth 3 bdr., t baUt, aflordabtc C-1
CufUm built, Odthill su bd i'^ o  3 bd . 3 bath (Iraplact R-13
Fram« home. 1 Bdr . 1 bai tOU) «I backyard £-1
Very nice, 2 bdr.. 1 baUi. comer lot. Ai lotose FHA lean E-X
New on market, bnck. XOIO 1 3/4 batta. Ut/A. E-3
Hw> »  Eait. 3 bdr . 2 baUi. CH/A. FHA appraiaad R-1
Young Â .Jn., 2 Bdr., 1 baUi, Aaaumable FHA lonn. R-2
Bargain priced. 2 bdr.. 1 bath, cloae to downtown R.3
Owner finance. 2 bdr . 1 bath, cornar lot R-4
Urge 2 bdr . 1 bath. CH/A R.6
Like new, bnck, 2 bdr.. 2 bath. CH/A, fireplace, icrcened back porch. R4 
Meadowbrook Addn., 3 bdr . 3 bath, fireplace, bajement. R-7 
Bnck, 3 bdr., 1 1/2 bath, one car garage, fenced backyard C/H. R4 
Completely Remodeled. 2 bdr . 2 I lOtC^Pl^ct. large comer let. R4 
Just luted. Young AddiUon. 3 bdr . 1 baUi.pnced to sell. R-l*
Eitra met, 3 bdr . 1 bath, beautifully dteorated. CH/A 
Country home. 3 bdr , I V4 KXO ? firepUcei on 1 acres. HA-1 
Besutiful new bnck home 3 bdr . 2 bath. 2 car garage on 3 ( acres HA-2 
Beautiful country home. 2 |OU>‘ bath, on 3 icres. HA-3 
3 aerea with lots SOU) bility. A4
Completely remodeled two bedroom 20U> «th. bargained priced Hodges Oak Park AddlUan R-U 
MEADOWBROOK ADDITION, 3 bdr., I 1/2 batf 30U> Fenced backyard Pnead te leU R-ll 
OAKHILL SUBDIVISION-Bcautifu arup home, large Uvii  ̂ room, dimng raom-kMcben rimWnatlw. I h#.. t 
bath, CH/A large lot. R-13
PINE STREET-Very nice 2 bdr., 1 bath, with grtenhouae R-14 

; Joe Young Addibon-Recently remodeled, s goy,! haUi. large comer lot with fenced backyard. R-U 
FHA assumable loan, large 2 bdr., 1 bath. nUing fans, hrepisce. garden apet R-l<
BEAUTIFULLY LANDSCAPED, stucco home. 3 bdr , 1 bath. petM deck R-17
Beautiful home. 3 bdr., 1 1/2 baths, bird house, green house gas gnll. on 2.3 aertt HA4
Bargain pneed. large comer lot, 3 bdr . 1 bath, with fireplace R-ll
NICE HOME, 2 bdr , 1 bath on approximately 2 acres HA4
OLDEN, Approximately 2 acres. 2 bdr., 1 1/2 baths HA4
STRAWN, Small 2 bdr., StXO pneed to seU VI
Strawn. 3 bdr . 1 3/4 baths on 3 loU V2
41 9313 acres with large Unk stocked with fuh. good hiMting. A-l 
33 acres near new school A-2
Lake Leon-2 Bdr., 1 bath on a> 30U) oatcly 2 acres Owner fuiancc HA-7 
121 30 Motulr Herne. 2 Bdr . I 'l bathe. C/H on 3 lou Priced U aeU 
CADDO Texas, Mobile Home - 2 Bdr . IS bat)«. CH/A on 1 330 acrat 
Assumable FHA Loan, no qualifying. 2 Bdr., 1 bath C4 
Owner Flnance-3 Bdr., 1 bath. E4
A Very Attractive Bnck. 2 Bdr , 1»« bath, fireplace. CH/A. Pnvacy Fence aa large let E-7
OAK HOLLOW LANE-Eiquuite. Bnck. 2 Bdr 2S baths with all the eitras E4
3 Bdr., 1 bath Older Home E9
3 acres, cleared with city water A-3
Hwy 10 East-10 acres with 3 bdr.. 1 bath hume HA4
Morton Valley. 12 acres, 3 Bdr.. SOU) -ountry home HA-7
GOOD BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY-Hwy 10 Weft, Ranger, Well eetabliihed Raataurant aw I.S aerea. C4
LOCATED ON HWY 00 East. Ranger, Completelr Remodeled inside Reatamm wMb gaad IwcanM C4
Owner Finance 10.31 acres with older home, minerals included. HA4
100 acres - fenced, water weU. stock tank, older home. Hwy frontage, minerale A4
Hwy 80 West. Nice 2 Bdr , 1 bath, frame home on 0 13 aeree R-17
Energy Efficient, 2 Bdr., IS bath, CH/A. R-ll
LOTS
Lot at La sotX) >LU

EiWfW* «noun tint eiectncitv 
mo water are a aangeroui comona 
ton But (M you know mat an ewetrK 
aookance it tta eiectrKaoy atme even 
It tne suaten is on ’  If tne ohiq is n 
tne DOu«r It on So wnen you «feo 
aookancet near water «reo tnerr 
unotuggeo r - __-  -  - -

COMMERCIAL 
3300 sq. ft. building, tome owner finance. C-1 
Good business, ideal ocation on main in Ranger, C-2 
Good business, good location In Eastland, C4 
Hwy 10 West-Good business, C4
T H ^ E ^  BUSINESSEVSeU on, k )U) uU makmg go«l money, owner fmance, loc«ion Raaper. Eaetiand A

Shirley Griffith 
647-1635

Charles Arnett 
647-1324

Kenneth Grice 
647-5127

E^ch Office is Independently Owned and Operated 
Financing Available

Ray Moody 
725-7279 
*47-5191

MORE LISTINGS AVAllJkBLE
Century 21 Mortgage CorporaUon - 5% down

lUNWUlC 
SaiAU MOWilAMCn.
tonne* M Newt Mtec Ml ortar*3»m«AMt«ncp •î attt̂ en aR«KXW'wr«iw*4ÎaBo»eee»wi mx Clasoitiod lia su lt«

1 « #4 «•
i.1  4 4

James W. Ratliff Realtor-Broker
Ranger

111 E. Main St. Ranger, Texas 
Office 647-1260 Home Phone 647-1667

One of the nicer homes in Ranger. Brick, comer lots, 
three full baths, two large bedrooms, large den, living 
roan, seperate dining room, two storage buildings, 
beautiful yard. This really is one of the nicer homes in 
Ranger.

A good brick two bedroom, one bath, central heat, fenc­
ed back yard, 144 lots on the comer. $32,000. Will FHA 
finance.

room, garage. Close to down towit 
Just out of Raager

22 acres «rith nice brick home, throe bodrooms, two 
baths, woodbuming fireplace in living room, w ry  nice kit­
chen, utility room, den, screened porch, carport. Cut up 
into several pastures with two bams.

Beautiful three bedroom, 144 baths, green house, large 
den, very attractive yard. This house is on 2.6 acres of 
land.

Two acres at land with three bsdroomi, tiro battle, 
woodbuming fireplace, ceiling fan. Utility room, all 
plumbing, seven pecan trees, four fruit trsas.

Three bedrooms, 1V4 bath^fenced back yard, garage, 
utility room, den. This p la !6 ^  priced to sell. $14,000.

Brick three bedrooms, two baths, central heat and air, 
woodbuming fireplace, utility room. This place Is on 9 
acres of land.

Oak Hill Addition, Brick, three bedrooms, 2 baths, 
woodbuming fireplace, study. Will FHA.

Large spacious home with three bedrooms, separate 
dining room, large living room, office, fenced back yard. 
Almost 1/4 block across the street from the house with 
carport for motor home, boat, and car.

Lake Leon
Very nice two bedroom, three baths, large living ar«a, 

game room, screened back porch, two storage buildings, 
garage, carport, fenced front yard. On avtry valuable 
deeded lot.

'Two bedrooms, 1 bath, new plumbing, garage, pens and 
shop building.
Two story home with 1 bath and two bedrooms upstairs, 

two bedrooms, 1 bath downstairs, Uving room, dining 
>o o o o o »o o w o »o o o 0 O W 0 a a ^ a w <

Out of E^ftland
Just out of City limits 444 acres of land, no im­

provements. $10,000.00

Out of Gorman
196 acres of land in Comanche County. About one-half in 

cultivation and Coastal, the other half in native pasture.

KING INSURANCE AGENCY REAL ESTATE
207 MAIN RANGER Phone: 647-1171

THREE S'TORY brick building, includes 2 offices (now 
ren ta l Four furnished apartments and plenty of space 
for business expansion. Owner will finance.
FOUR BEDROOM, 2 bath, asbestos siding, large kitchen, 
living room, close in • $27,500.00 
NICE 3 bedroom dwelling, 2 baths, garage and storage. 1 
bedroom mobile home, all on 3 lots with beautiful oak 
tx*6as 830 000
GOOD COMMERCUL BUSINESS; 8 mobile homes and 2 
additional apartments on 74x fenced lots. All rented and 
good income. COME SEE US!
'BEAUTIFUL 3 bedroom home, large den, 144 baths, utOi- 
ty, greenhouse, 2-car garage, new custom drapes, carept, 
fruit trees, all on fenced 2.6 acres. $55,000.

THREE BDR., 1 bath, combined dining area and kitchen, 
carpet, panelled, chain link fenced yard on 5 lots. $20,000.
4 BDR., L.R., 2 bath, carport, carpeted, also 2 bdrm. rent 
house. Large storage house, paved street. All on 6 lots.
$33,500.
3 BDR., den, L.R., 2 bath, kitchen with built-ins. Study, 
fireplace, carpeted, shade trees, storage bldg., fenced in.
$49,500.
TWO BEDROOMS, living-dining room, kitchen, one bath, 
utUtty room, on 11 lots, needs repair. Also, newly 
decorated small one bedroom, living room, kitchen, bath.
All for $17,500.00. $7500.00 equity and assume $10,000 note.

Mrs. Opal C. King Lee RoiseD
M7-1510 M7-1S8S

NICE 3 BR, den, living room, dining arm , new carpet, In­
sulated. 2 car garage and new petto. All on 7 phm Iota, 
close in.
THREE BEDROOM, two baths, utility, carpet, with small 
acreage, Just out side of dty Umlta.
TWO STORY, ten rooms, two baths, two nice lota, good 
neighborhood, needs repairs. Owner will dlacun price.
BEAUTIFUL rock, three bedroom, three hatha, Uvii^ 
room, den, built-in cabinets, carpeted, central haat k  air, 
wood-burning fireplace, two car garage and earpert, two 
storage buildings, 40 pecan trees, on two acras, just out­
side dty limits.
T H R E E  bedroom  ^  q m  both, <lon, b o w  p h w n M f ,

comer lot, cloai § O V A r .
EASTLAND-ttiree bedrooms, two baths, carpet, utUlty, 
newly decorated. Cloee la on good noighboriwod, coov 
pletely furnished. $40,000, owner will Oanneo.
VERY NICE 2 story, 3 bdrm., I  bath, kne(^ ptaa ktleliaB 
cabinets, built in dishwashsr and orea, caNml heat, 
refrigerated air conditionars, catling teas, carport and 
garage, storm windows, 100 x NO lot, good location. 
STRAWN • Neat 2 Br., large bath, Uving 
room, kitchen, utility room, carpet, 
sulated, asbeatoa clad. gUJQO.

^  ̂ 1 Wk- — 5 ^
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SUPER
DUPER

ipn

DOUBLE COUPONS 7 DAYS
BRING IN ANY NUMBER OF MANUFACTURER'S CENTS OFF COUPONS AND WE'LL 
DOUBLE YQ.UR SAVINGS. OFFER EXCLUDES RETAILER OR FREE COUPONS, CIGARETTES 
OR TOBACCO COUPONS, OR REFUND CERTIFICATES. COUPON VALUE CANNOT 

EXCEED THE VALUE OF THE ITEM. LIMIT RIGHTS RESERVED.

DELI

Eoft Hiway 80 Eoitloiid 

7 A M  - 10 PM  SEVEN DAYS 

Prices Ending 

August 30, 1983

Gerbers Baby

4/88

Crest I

Toothposte 9 9 ^
reg. or mint Jel 4.6 oz.

Meads
Theme Poper

19*
When yoe perches« « pkg. of H

Golden Brown

Fried Chicken
8 pc. - *2.89

Ireakfast Special
^crom bled Eggs, A A C  
Bocon, Nosh Browns, “ “  
irovy. Biscuits

4.S oz.

Mouthwosh
Peter Pan

Peonut Butter
Sm oother $ 1  9 Q
Crunchy is oz. ■ •  w l r

Post

Toasties 99^

BAKERY
Petite

Cinnomon 99'
Rolls ‘ “• !*«•

Germ

Saust

9
.'e ir*«.«. • k

Country Style

Pork Ribs *1.48
Quarter Sliced'

Poih Lob> ,tl .58
Good Value

Bacon ^1,29
A . peckog«

G e n e r ic

B
1 1/2 lb. loaf

1 \\\

Bounce

Fabric Softener

»1.99Reg. or 

unscented 40 ct

Birdseye Little Ears

Cob Com ̂ 1 «78
iipok Save 51*

Come-n-Get It

|0og Food ̂ 7*991
^  lb. Bonus Bog

Folgers $ i  a a

Coffee
AN Grinds

» d u
112: 30*

1ft. can' 3 0 *

Shoemokor's
CANDY

OFF with this coupon
8 VARIETIES including: 
Poanut Brittle, Divinity,
& Chcxrolate Pudge...

Eostfcind Store rf

Borden's

Yogurt 3  to r^ l.O O
oN Flavors *

Borden's

Butter
*• u " .4 l  , 9 9

For

PARKER FLORIST 
Footboll Mums
^ 5 . 9 9  «"«• «P ‘

FREE Homs DeRvery 
wHhin 5 M iss

PRODUCE

Colifomio Casselman

Red Plums ib. M *
CalHomia Med. Size

Avocodos
4 for »1.00

H o m e m a k i n g
H lf i t a

CMatjr Brt Ag*»i
J a « « t  T l i « « i M

Today’ s fam ily is an 
unrecognized ecom om ic 
giant. Households control 38 
prcent of the national wealth 
while corporations control 31 
percent, government 22 per­
cent and agriculture 9 per­
cent. Families also have the 
m ajor influence on the 
physical, intellectual and 
social development of our 
human resources.

Since 1914. the Texas 
A gricu ltu ra l E xtension  
home economics program 
has worked closely with 
Texas families to teach them 
how to apply research - 
tested  p ra ctice s  for 
household management and 
family development.

The Family living Com­
mittees in each county serve 
as an advisory committee to 
Extension agents in recom­
mending and developing 
educational programs that 
will meet the needs and in­
terests of families in the 
County.

E xten sion  hom e
e co n o m ics  p rogram s
develop and strengthen the 
ability of families and in­
dividuals to extend their in­
comes, improve their health 
through preventive care and 
nutrition, and increase their 
well-being during economic 
and social change and uncer­
tainty.

The E astland County 
Family Living Committee 
members met this week. The 
committee discussed and 
identified some of the major 
needs and concerns of 
families.

The committee identified 
the program area of health 
and nutrition for educational 
in depth programming star­
ting in 1984.

Health care costs are con­
tinuing to rise at an alarm­
ing rate. To avoid the high 
cost of health care, Texans 
are encouraged to prevent il­
lness. Nutrition a ffects  
health. Inadequate nutrition 
has been identified as a 
possible contributor to cor­
onary disease, cancer, high 
blood pressure, diabetes, 
dental caries, and liver 
disease. Along with diet life 
style choices also influence 
health such as stress, limited 
amount of exercise and 
smoking.

E du cation a l hom e 
economics programs will be 
available to the public which 
will address these concerns.

The Family Living Com­
mittee members which were 
present at this w eek’ s 
meeting include: Marie Dun­
can, Dorothy Underwood, 
Margaret Corbell, Debbie 
Corlee, Mattie rose, Edna 
Bint, Ruthie Keyes, I/)is 
C ren w elge , G en ev ieve  
Jones, Alice Brooks, Jane 
Stark and Janet Thomas, 
County Extension Agent.

RECIPE FOR THE WEEK 
Clubs and other organiza­

tions get into full swing once 
September arrives. Club 
meetings often include a 
refreshm ent tim e. The 
recipe I’m including is the 
grand champion winner of 
the [.ampasas County Fair 
this summer. When you are 
a club hostess, you might 
like to use this one for it 
sounds good.

PEANUT BUTTER BAL1.S
2 cups crunch peanut butter 
1 stick melted oleo
1 box powdered sugar
3 cups rice Krispies

Mix all ingredients. Form 
into small balls, one inch in 
diameter and freeze.

In large double broiler 
melt;
1 large Hershey Bar
1 (6 oz.) bag of chocolate
chips

bar of paraffin 
Dip frozen  ba lls  in 

chocolate mixture. Place in 
candy wrappers to harden. 
Keep in cool place or in 
refrigerator. Makes about 
100-200. (The infornuition 
given herein is for educa­
tional purposes on ly . 
Reference to a commercial 
product or trade name is 
made with the understan­
ding that no discrimination 
is intended and no endorse­
ment by the T exas 
Agricultural Service is im­
plied.

L
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Rates Go Up!
In

County
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Rotary Governor Visits Local Club
The Rev. Stone Risinger of 

Arlington, District Gover­
nor of Rotary Clubs in this 
region, attended an assem­
ble of the Cisco Rotary Club 
Wednesday night and paid 
his official visit to the club at 
their regu la r w eekly 
meeting Thursday noon at 
the Colony Restaurant.

Rev. Risinger, an Arl­
ington minister for some IS 
years, told Ciscoans that he 
was unpressed with their 
club and its possibilities and 
opportunities for community 
service.

“ Rotary is more than 78 
years of age and it is still 
basically local," the district 
governor said. “ Rotary In­
ternation al has nearly 
1,000,000 members in S7 
countries with 20,000 clubs." 
The clubs operate with two 
slogans: (1) Service above 
s e lf ;  and (2 ) He a c ­
complishes most who serves 
best," he added.

The club with good and ac­
tive committees are strong 
clubs. Rev Rismger said. He 
recommended that the Cisco 
club assign a director to 
head club service activities, 
another to urge vocational 
service, and a third to em- 
phasue commumty service

The district leader pomted

DISTRICT GOVERNOR Stone Risinger of Arlington, left, and Presi­
dent Allen Masters of the Cisco Rotary Oub were photographed at the 
local club’s naeeting last Thursday. (Staff Photo)

to Rotary’s activités on an 
in tern ation al level as 
evidence of the growing 
value as a service organiza­
tion. He said that more than 
13,000 young people, in­
cluding over 1,200 last year, 
have participated in the

Rotary Scholarship Pro­
gram “ as our contribution to 
the leaders of tomorrow."

Allen Masters, president 
of the Cisco club, introduced 
the speaker. Guest included 
.Mrs. Risinger and Mrs. 
Masters along with Cliff

Deckard of Coleman.
The district governor in­

spected club records and 
discussed the local club's 
program at the Wednesday 
night meeting. Rotarían Dell 
Crockett will be in charge of 
next week's program.

cus by I». J .  HERI»A 
A w icr ic ja * »  B « i» t  K v a d  
Nyndicatard Photo 
C'oluBiiil!i>t
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W e never think atXHit, we never plan for, the worst At 
least I don t While that may be an optimistic approach to 
life. It sometimes presents some problems 

There was the time I spent several hours in sub-treez- 
ing weather shooting skiers breaking off a headwall on 
the slopes in northern Wisconsin Everything went per­
fectly except the film-advance system on the cam­
era. which rather ignominiously chose that day to mal­
function The counter worked, and I ran off half a dozen 
rolls before realizing later that night something had gone 
wrong

Well. I learned my lesson At least I thought so So 
when the outfitters running Algonquin Photo Experience 
in Ontario. Canada, arranged for me to attend a moose 
shoot. I decided nothing would go wrong

I began the trip by packing all my photo gear in a 
single bag which I could carry on the plane with me I re- 
rmjved all the unexposed film cartridges from the boxes 
ar>d skpped them «nto a large plastic bag As 1 passed 
through the airline X-ray inspection station, I removed 
the bag and asked that it be hand checked to avoid pos­
sible X-ray damage No problem 

When I arrived at Algonquin National Park some 200 
miles north of Toronto, I double-checked all my gear to 
make sure everything was in working order All lenses 
were safely packaed in crush-proof lens cases, and the 
camera bodies, flash, and other accessories were wrap­
ped in impact-absorbing foam

The motorized launch took us from the dock to the 
base camp, where I carefully unpacked all my equip­
ment and made ready for that afternoon s canoe expedi­
tion up river in search of moose Organizers Richard 
Sharp and Dave Frame swore that, in two years of run­
ning the northwoods workshops, they d never failed to 
see big game I was getting a bit antsy by then, anxious 

but I was careful not to be slipshod When the time to 
set out arrived, everything was stowed properly in the 
canoe I d brought along plenty of plastic bags to keep 
the equipment dry Nothing was going to go wrong 
Nothing Ahh. the optimism, again 

We d been paddling for just a couple of hours when I

realized there were a few bugs in the plans It seemed 
that every few hundred feet or so, I took the camera out 
for a photo. I quickly grew tired of zipping and unzipping 
the camera bag and finally left the bag open with the 
covered lens peeking out. Each time I pulled my paddle 
in to grab the camera —  and while changing sides from 
left to right —  a light spray of water accompanied it, and I 
had to make a conscious effort to keep the gear dry.

After another hour or so, I noticed something else I 
hadn't planned on The water from the paddles had ac­
cumulated in the bottom of the canoe, run back to my 
position, and pooled around the camera bag, which was 
water repellent, but not resistant. Then, as evening drew 
near arxf the temperature of the water dropped, the 
dampness in the bag condensed on the lenses as I 
brought them out. Each time I went to shoot, I had to wait 
a few second until the lenses cleared. * * '

Finally, after nearly hours of padektng. we met 
success in the form of a cow, her two yearlings, and an 
amorous bull moose with a rack so large, he could have 
used it as a sail in a C-Class race As we beached the 
canoes and climbed ashore to take the shots we'd 
waited for, I couldn't help but think how lucky we'd been. 
The equipment was still in relatively good shape We got 
our photos. And we returned intact

Ahh, but back at base camp, the news wasn't quite so 
good The second group that set out ran into rougher 
canoeing, One daring duo hung their canoe up on a sub­
merged log and, in an effort to free it, nearly swamped 
themselves They didn't actually tip it, but they did man­
age to take on water —  which swooshed through one of 
the photographer's bags, leaving his four lenses and 
two Canon bodies swamped. The results: all his equip­
ment was useless, and repairs would run several 
hundred dollars

He should have had a waterproof bag, of course —  
and kept it closed whenever he wasn't rummaging 
around for his equipment It could never have happened 
to me. of course Nor will it happen to you But still, I can't 
help but w onder. . .

ITT OWNAPHONE  
Owning your own 

phone can save 
you money!

in  And 
WEBCOR

PC bOO Phones
If you're renting a pnone from the phone company, your 
monthly bill includes a rental fee. in the long run, that fee can 
add up to far more than the cost of a new ITT telephone. For 
example, if your current rental charge is S2 • S3 per month, an itt 
phone priced at less than $50.00 can pay for itself in less than 2 
years! All ITT phones are FCC approved, so they re legal to install. 
They're backed by a one-year, limited warranty on parts and 
service. And the ITT own-A-Phone« line offers exciting features 
and styles you won't find with other telephones. Let us show you 
how easy it is to own your phone soon.

Cisco Press
442 2244

Eastland Telegram Ranger Times
6291707 6471101
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Rising Star
643 4141

ênîôfTîtîien!n i Award Presented Stamey
Nutrition Meni

When you go to the store 
and find canned goods on 
sale you are inclined to buy 
more than you need. Then if 
you are prone to forgetting 
foods in the larder or tucking 
away something special for 
some emergency that never 
seems to come, try dating 
each label when you first un­
pack the groceries. As you 
put foods away, move older 
cans and packages to the 
f r o n t .

When you reach for an in­
gredient take a second to 
check that you are following 
good nutrient accounting 
practices by using the Fifo 
method....first in, first out.

If necessary, plan at least 
one meal a month specifical­
ly to use aging products. And 
if you stare at the caii or 
package regularly with no 
incentive or interest in using 
it, give it to someone who 
will.

S torage tim e and
temperatures are significant 
factors in assessing the 
nutritional life expectancy of 
any foods. This is especially 
true of p rocessed  and 
packaged products. Even 
the seem in gly  durable 
g rocery  item s, like
powdered milk, an item we 
rarely think of as “ going 
bad”  are affected.

Next week, we will talk 
about temperatures and how 
it affects your canned goods.

The programs for the past 
week in c lu d ed : Janet 
Thomas of the Extension of­
fice presented a nutrition 
talk entitled “ Centsible 
Meals” ; Eastland came to 
Cisco for game day; and Dr. 
M.A. Treadwell presented 
several musical numbers us­
ing his "Musical Saw" ac­
com pan ied  by M rs. 
Treadwell at the piano.

The menus for the coming 
week are:

M O N D A Y -L iver loa f, 
p ota toes , stew ed
to m a to e s /g re e n  beans, 
jello/banana, bread, butter 
and drink.

W E D N E S D A Y -S w is s  
steak, hominy/cheese sauce, 
pineapple and carrot jello, 
birthday cake, bread, butter 
and drink.

FRIDAY-Beef pattie, pin­
to beans, potatoes, apple- 
carrot-celery salad, banana 
pudding, bread, butter and 
drink. Ruth Cartee 

Program Chairman

O.L. Stam ey, retired  
educator and long-tim e 
Cisco church and civic 
leader, was presented a 
Presidential Citation for 
Outstanding Contributions in 
Lionism  in cerem on ies  
Wednesday noon at the 
weekly luncheon meeting of 
the Cisco Lions Club.

The presentation was 
made by Dr. Bill Auvenshine 
of Ranger, a past Lions 
district governor, who read a 
letter that accompanied the 
handsome medal from E.J. 
(Ebb) Grindstaff, of Ball­
inger, immediate past presi­
dent of Lions International 
who conferred the honor on 
Mr. Stamey.

Mr. Stamey, a past presi­
dent of Cisco Lions and past 
district governor in 2E-1, has 
been a Lion for 47 years and 
has a perfect attendance 
record for that period of 
time.

In making the presenta­
tion, Dr. Auvenshine noted 
that “ O.L. Stamey is a Lion 
who always wanted to be 
rem em bered  as an 
‘ outstanding past district 
governor’ rather than as a 
•good district governor’ . And 
he has the reputation 
throughout the district as a 
past district governor who is 
still very much on the job. in 
Lionism."

Mr. Stamey served as 
district governor in 1953-54 
and was in attendance at the 
first meeting of the board for 
the Lions Camp for Crippled 
Children at KerrviUe, Dr. 
A uvenshine sa id . Mr. 
Stamey has attended 64 
meetings of the camp board 
over the years.

Dr. Auvenshine said that 
only 200 presidential cita­
tions for outstanding Lions 
are presented in a year in the 
United States. This award, 
he noted, is the second 
highest in Uonism -  second 
to the coveted Ambassador 
of Good Will for Lionism, he 
added.

In his early 80s, Mr. 
Stamey remains active in 
church and conununity af­
fairs and never misses a 
Lions Club meeting. He is a 
frequent speaker to Uons 
clubs in the area. Both Mr. 
and Mrs. Stamey are retired 
educators and their only son 
is Dr. Joe Stamey, professor 
at McMurry College in 
Abilene. He was a guest at 
the luncheon.

Mr. Stamey told Lions that 
“ I appreciate this fine honor 
but I don’t think I deserve it" 
in a brief talk after accep­
ting the medal. He added 
that “ members of the Cisco

Tile Cisco Press
Sunday,

August 28, 1983

HARGRAVE INSURANCE 

AGENCY
I I M A v e . D
Cisco, Tex

Personol Soles A Service For
— HOME Insuronce 

Cor Insurance
-  Commercial Business Insuronce

tjm Aueott L

Mobile Home Insurance t, Trovel Trailers

— Boot Insurance

— LHe Insurance 
Bonds Of All Kinds

Shirley A. Hargrove 
442-1477 Or 442-1059

LEARN TO BE A TRAVEL AGENT

For the first time irv Abilene 
Professional classes in the 

Exciting field of travel

YOUR PASSPORT TO...

AN EXCITING CAREER 

AN OPPORTUNITY TO SEE THE WORLD 

NEW AND DIFFERENT EXPERIENCES

BEGINNING SEPTEMBER 12th

FO R  M O R E  IN F O R M A T IO N  & 
d e t a i l s  CALL

I - 8 0 0 - 3 9 1 - 4 5 S 0

4

FOUR SEASONS TRAVEL 
INSTITUTE

DR. BILL Auvenshine, left above, was 
presenting O.L. Stamey with a presidential 
citation for outstanding contributions to 
Lionism when the above picture was 
made.-Staff Photo

Uons Club deserve all the 
credit for anything 1 was 
able to accom plish  as 
district governor and as a 
member over the years.”

Lion W inston
H eidenheim er, program  
chairman for the day, in­
troduced Dr. Auvenshine.

Guests at the luncheon in­
cluded Mrs. O.L. Stamey,

Dr. Joe Stamey, Mrs. Elarl 
Ray, Mrs. E.L. Jackson, 
John Parchman, Mrs. Bruce 
Smith and sons Tim and 
Tony, Mark Heidenheimer, 
Mrs. Winston Heidenheimer, 
Mrs. James McCracken, 
Mrs. Rufus Merket, Mrs. 
Gene Abbott, Mrs. John 
McGuire, Mrs. J.C. Flet­
cher, Mrs. Charles Clark and 
Mrs. Jasper Cook.

501 S. Daugherty Eastland 
629-3222

Free Ceramic Classes Thursday Nights 
™"'""'"""^^^ru8ir""^^C Floss 
Baby Gifts Kits: Counted Cross Sdtch 
Needle Point Candle Wicking

Back Hoe Service
Kirby Welding 

Call
442-3721

Day or Night Cisco, Texas

Steam Cleaning Service 
& Welding Also

Lesley Michele Enterprises
Aluminum Can Recycler 
Buying Aluminum Cans 

23' P«** pound Open Sat„ Sun. & Mon.
Closed From l:00-2:00 For Lunch 

647-5337
A t Ranger, Texas On Tiffin Road About 

3/10 of a mile from Red Light T:7s|

Opening August 22 
The Dog House

If your dog isn’t becoming to you It should be coming to 
us,

Poodle Grooming 
and

Other small breeds 
Hiway 80 West behind 
Harps (Cabinet Shop 

817-629-1403
Penny Coplen Susan Alexander

T-73

. U  7Y> I n / O / . S T f J l i Y
StAT COVERS — VINYL TOPS 

CAPPE’ S BOAT SEATS 
TREE ESTIMATES 

CISCO AUTO  TRIM

Hwy 80 West --  C'S«

J  - Í  t r y j WILLIAM
JOHNSON

Quality Workmanship
Williatn^B P a in t in g  

Residential & Commercial 
Interiors - Exteriors 
Spray - Brush - Roller

Bill Wehner *̂4^  Estimateg

Mary Kay Cosmetics
Now ovoilobla in Ci»co For a privata, 

complimenlory (ociol or raordar coll

VIRGIE GREGG

B E A U n  CONSULTANT g  

Î ê V i a  442-3460 P-91tfc
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County School Districts 
Report Little Change

SUNDAY, AUGUST » ,  IMS

Eastland
M e m o r ia l  H o s p ita l

The School Systerm of 
Eastland County report only 
a few changes in enrollment 
from that of fall, 1982. Some 
schools have lost a small 
number of students, while 
others have gained.

C arbon Independent 
School district has gained in 
enrollment from last year. 
The 1983 total is 49 in High 
School, 23 in Junior High, 
and 69 in Elementary • a

total of 141. The total enroll­
ment in 1982 was 125.

Eastland Independent 
School District has a 1983 
enrollment of 543 Elemen­
tary students, 160 in Junior 
High, and 224 in High School. 
The toUl is 927. The 1982 
total was 935.

The Rising Star School 
District has 89 enrolled in 
High School for 1983. and 205 
in Elementary, a total of 294. 
The 1982 enrollment was 312.

TEXAS

In the Gorman schools the 
1983 total enrollment is 345. 
This is one student more 
than the 1982 enrollment of 
344.

The Ranger Independent 
School District reports that 
367 have enrolled in the 
Elementary for 1983, and 316 
in High School, with a total of 
683. The 1982 enrollment was 
686.

Cisco Schools have 230 
enrolled in the Primary this 
year, with 293 in In­
termediate, 154 in Junior 
High, and 257 in High School. 
This makes a total of 934 for 
1983. Cisco’s total enrollment 
for 1982 was 995.

The 1983 total for all six 
schools in the county adds up 
to 3324 students, with a total 
in 1982 of 3397.

Lynda E. Smart 
Glenna J. Clifton 
Ruth W. Reese 
Clemente Z. Rodriquez 
Billie Sue Chance 
Susan Spruill 
Ralph H. Cozart 
Cecil Ray Brown 
Edna Wellborn 
Vertia M. Starr 
Luther C. Swinson 
Baby Boy Starr 
Billye Faye Shelton 
I.aQuinta McKensie 
Pearl Garrett 
Laura Barber 
Archie O. Easley 
Fay Owings 
Thelma Jones 
Willie Jo Carter 
Ruth Reeves 
Boon K. Boggs 
Lucy Stoker 
Ada Wright 
Artie A. Fleming

IN TEXAS SCHOOLS
TSTA Tips For Parents

County 
News Briefs

The  Texas State 
Teachers Association 
wants to become part­
ners with parents In ad- 
varKlng quality educa­
tion In our Texas public 
schools. The following 
Is the first In an eight 
part series to assist 
parents In helping 
children learn at home, 
as well as In school. 
The first series focuses 
on "reading "

Developing 
Good Readers, 

Part I
Read to your child 

often Make a pleasant 
experience of the event, 
making sure the session 
is relaxed and unhurried. 
Let your child choose a 
favorite story and explain 
pictures and answer 
questions about it. A s - 
time goes by you can 
stop in the middle of a 
familiar story and ask 
what happens next. This 
encou rages m em ory 
skills and reinforces the 
material in the text.

Begin talking to your 
child from infancy Make 
sounds, call attention to 
sounds and connect and 
explain activities as you

perform them. Listen 
and encourage conver­
sation with you.

Answer questions pat­
iently and as promptly as 
possible. Play listening 
games with your child. A 
good bedtime game is to 
listen quietly and identify 
as m any sounds as 
possible— heartbeats, 
breathing, traffic. Listen­
ing attentively is essen­
tial in learning.

When your child is 
learning to read, try 
‘ 'labeling” household 
objects with the child's 
name printed in bold let­
ter on masking tape. En­
courage the reading of 
signs, posters-every- 
thing!

Besides regular child­
ren's materials, read 
aloud from ordinary 
books, m agazines,

.  r>ewspapers, advertise-.^ 
ments. Your child will 
begin to recognize the 
fact that the printed word 
is a part of everyday life 
that conveys useful, in­
teresting and amusing 
information.

EASTLAND

The annual meeting of contributors to Eastland Memorial 
Hospital will be held at 11:00 a.m. September 14, at the 
Hospital Board Room. Directors will be electing for the ensu­
ing year, and any other business that may come up will be 
discussed.

The Eastland Rifle and Pistol Club will hold its annual dove 
warmup, skeet and trap shoot, Sunday, August 28, starting at 
1 p.m. at the Eastland Qub range. Price per round will be 
$3.00 for non-club members and $2.50 for club members. 
Everyone is invited to attend.

RISING STAR

The Rising Star High School cheerleaders are sponsoring 
an ice cream supper for the Booster Club and football team 
on Thursday, Sept. 1 at the football field. All are welcome to 
join the Booster Club in supporting the fighting Wildcats of 
1983.

The Griggs School Reunion will be held September 4 in the 
Senior Citizens Center in Rising Star. Lunch will be at 12:30 
p.m. Everyone is invited to come and bring a covered dish.

The second annual meeting of the Elm Cemetery Associa­
tion of the Okra Community will be held at The Rising Star 
Bank Community Room, Monday night, August 29, 1983 at 
8:00 p.m. Anyone interested is invited to come.

Next: Developing  
G ood Readers, Part 
II.

S u b r i : i t { ( d  b y :  I::u;;erie K i n s e r ,
P r e s i d o n t - L a s t l a n d  J o u n t y  T S T A

EXPERT
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Specializing in Poodles

Goldci? ©cstiiiy
West Highway 80 
Open Mon. - Fri. 9 - 5 

629-8492 629-8194

Operated By; 
Lorraine Leëter TC

U-Sove Pharmacy
Enjoy Our

Drive-In Window Service 

Convenient Coll Ahead 

Good Parking

Open 8-6 Weekdoys 

8-1 Soturdoy

201 S. Daugherty 
629-1166

All Remaining 
Spring & Summer

SHOES *12. 
BAGS *10.

New Fall & Winter 
Merchandise Available

Check with Us for 
BACK TO SCHOOL

Sfiftoe Sfnoft/ie
20 629-2472

All Remaining
 ̂ f

Spring & Summer j ; 
Merchandise

•5 - *25

Fall And Winter

25% OFF

David & Quetta’s
Ipterstate 20 629-8030

Sidney Robertson 
Mary McClure 
Dale Murdock Sr. 
Exie M. King 
Patsy Jones 
Ruby S. Fetty 
Mary Ward 
Floyd Robertson 
Margarett Parson 
Neomi Hutton 
Palonus J. Wheat

CDRAPERIES
DRAPERIES
DRAPERIES

1706 W. Commerce Eastland, Tx. 76448 817-629-1319
r c

Ranger
G e n e r a l H o c p ita l

l.ena Hatton 
Bruce Willis 
Bertha Hobbs 
Flora Jolly 
Robert Whisenant 
Cora Newman 
Faye Todd 
Polly Alexander 
Billy Blevins 
DeU Walker 
Susan Layne
Erma Nunez and Baby Boy 
Nancy Cothrum and Baby 
Boy
Ed Willingham

Graham
M e m o r ia l  H o c p ita l

y  w  ss  w  m w m ' w  w

JUST ARRIVED
Bedspreads-Com forters-Sheets-Mottress Pods

Factory Outlet Sole
Slightly Irregulars S p e e d s  Start At $20 

Twins - Full - Queen • King

The Bock Room
Behind Beil Draperies

1706 W. Com m erce Eastland, Tx. 629-1319
— — — — •  ^  *  ëfc

Cindy Smith 
Minnie Nelson 
Colleen Glazner 
Clara Cunningham 
Della McCarroU 
Artie Shirley 
Thelma Latson 
James Apple 
Eathel Bailey
H. D. WillLngtem 
Karylen Cathey
I. aVeda Massey 
Baby boy Smith

This used to 
be a forest.

Sale Every Day
At

Eastland Direct Factory
Outlet MobUe Home Sales
1-20 East 653-2432  

Home 629-2117
DouMe Wide« & Single Wide« 

FHA VA& Convendal Financing

Molnle Home Inturance

Mobile Home« Pulled & Releveled ’

Vacuum Cleaner iCity No.
1200 West Main
Eastland, Texas

817-629-8732

Po l k s  Here is the Deal o f the Year.

The All New Kirby Heritage -  •379.00
with Kirby Trade-In —^•299.00.

We are authorized Kirby Sales and Service.
Prices Good through Sept. 19.

Rebuilt Hoovers - Eureka Up Rights •39.00 - *49.00
12 Month Guarantee

Belts for Kirby’s 3  fo** ^ 1 .0 0  

Belts for Hoover Convertible 3  f®** ^ 1 .0 0  

Belts for Eureka Uprights 3  f®  ̂^1*00 

Eureka F & G Bags 2  f®  ̂ ^3*00

Type C Bags for Hoovers 3  ®̂** ^ 2 .0 0

Type A Bags for Hoovers 2  p^^* ^2e00

Rebuilt Kirby’s •129.00 -1 2  Month guarantee

We Stock the All New Panasonic Vacuum Oeaner, 
Light - Easy to push and will Clean as Well 

as any Vacuum built. CaU for FREE 
Home Demonstration...

817^29-8732
T-77
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Agriculture
SUNDAY, AUGUST 28. 1983

Gordon Spot F arm Irrigation
DeMarquis Gordon

The Honeydew aphids on 
pecan trees are causing a lot 
of concern around the coun­
ty. As the yellow aphid feeds 
on the underside of leaves, 
"honeydew” or sugar water 
is excreted by the pest. This 
sticky liquid falls down 
through the tree and is 
deposited on the upper leaf 
surface of leaves over which 
the aphid feeds.

The honeydew aphid does 
not do a great amount of 
damage to the trees unless 
the infestation is severe. If 
the infested trees are in your 
yard or near the driveway 
the greatest problem is the 
honeydew that falls on walks 
and cars. In this case, most 
people want to control the 
aphids

There are several ways to 
control the honeydew pro­
blem If the trees are not too 
large the aphids can be 
washed off with the use of a 
water hose provided you 
have good water pressure. 
Another method is to spray 
the trees with Malathion or 
Zolone or Guthion. Sevin will 
not kill the aphid If you 
spray your trees for weevils 
this week and you have a 
honeydew problem  you 
should mix one of the aphid 
insecticides with Sevin.

We are seeing more and 
more oak trees with drought 
injury The first sign is 
browning of the leaf margins 
with the dead area progress- 
int^nto"the leaf and causmg 
dessication of leaf tissue bet­
ween the veins toward the 
mid-rib. These leaves begin 
to fall ana in some cases the 
trees die This happens even 
in lawns where the lawn 
grass IS regularly watered. 
The oak tree roots are very 
deep and due to our drought 
for the past several years the 
root zone area has dried out. 
The drought of 1980 was 
especially hard on trees. The 
results of drought is still 
showing up

These symptoms can also 
be man-made An accumula­
tion of salt in the soil will 
cause drought symptoms. 
Salt accum ulation  can 
develop from using irriga­
tion water containing salts

or by the use of excessive 
rates of inorganic fertilizer. 
High salt concentration 
simply reduces the root ab­
sorption by the root hairs 
and may finally result in 
death of the roots. This salt 
injury, which is a form of 
man-made injury, is usually 
more severe in dry weather 
than in times with adequate 
rainfall.

Other man-made drought 
injury to oak trees may be 
caused by soil compaction, 
new construction near the 
trees, disturbance of the soil 
such as plowing or adding 
soil, gas leaks or misuse of 
herbicides.

E xtension  Plant
Pathologist Dr Chip I.ee. 
told us oak trees are showing 
these symptoms, throughout 
Central and West Texas

Valuable yard trees show­
ing these drought symptoms 
may be helped by slow, deep 
soaking with good quality 
water. Do not over fertilize 
these trees as this might add 
to a salt problem

Be on the look out for the 
Pecan weevil on pecan trees. 
They may not be a problem 
until we get a general ram. 
Some areas have had 
showers while some have 
not. Those who have some 
soil moisture under the trees 
should look for the weevils 
and spray when they see one 
or two of these insects. If 
pecan shuck worms have 
been a problem in the past, 
now is the time to control 
them for this year.

COLLEGE STA TIO N - 
Iirigation fuel bills may 
have many farmers thinking 
about ways to cut pumpmg 
costs.

Some produ cers with 
center-pivot and linear- 
move systems are changing 
from high or moderate 
pressure sprinklers to low- 
pressure sprinklers or spray 
nozzles as a means of reduc- 
mg irrigation pumping costs.

W ayne K eese , an 
agricultural engineer with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service, Texas A&M 
University System, says 
lower pressure does lower 
the power requirement and 
the amount of fuel needed to 
pump the same quantity of 
water He estimates the fuel 
reduction to be in proportion 
to the reduction in total 
pump operating head or 
pressure.

Switching to low-pressure 
sprinklers or spray nozzles 
also has other advantages 
and disadvantages, Keese 
explains

Application e fficien cy  
may be improved in some 
cases. That is, less water has 
to be pumped to get the re­
quired amount into the soil if 
the soil can absorb the water 
at the rate it's applied.

Runoff occurs when some 
soils do not absorb water fast 
enough Runoff does not 
have to leave the field to be 
detrimental, notes Keese. 
Water may simply run from 
high spots to low spots so 
that under-irrigation and 
over-irrigation occur within 
the field. *

Micro-basins or furrow 
dikes are being used by some

producers to hold the water 
in place under low-pressure 
systems.

Changing the system 's 
operating pressure will also 
affect the pump, says the 
engineer. Lower pressure 
usually means the pump will 
produce more water unless

its speed  is redu ced . 
Although this sounds good, 
the pumping rate may ex­
ceed the well's capacity. 
Speed can easily be adjusted 
on pumps driven by engines, 
but speed reduction is not 
possible when the pump is 
driven by a direct-connected

electric motor.

Keese recommends In­
vestiga tin g  proposed  
changes carefully. While 
fanners may benefit from 
reduced pumping costa and 
higher application efficiency 
by changing to low-pressure

irrigation  system s, the modification of cultural and 
change may also require mantgement practice^
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Exports Fail to Boost Farm Income
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Six Months
FREE Tide

With Purchase Of Maytag Washer

'8 3  figuras ara astimataa

CIASSIFIED ADS 
GET RESULTS

...get yours now— priced from $3

Eastland Telegram
110 W. Commerce

629-1707 Eastland

Classified Ads 
Get Results

JOHN DEERE
OWER

1

Sharp 
Frigidaire 

All Air Conditioners A r e X 0 %

Kitchen Aid 
Sat Tracker

Eastland Electric Supply Co. Inc.
400 S. Seaman Eastland. 629-3315 

Hour§: 7:30 - 5 Mon. -Fri.
7:30 - 12:00 Sat.

A u c tio n 's  B e s t

by Fred Tucker

*1961 Auction MaOiatlng Network

RETIRING OR MOVING?
At least 18 per cent of the people in A m erica 

will m ove this year. And m any of you are think­
ing about retiring. These decisions are a part o f 
your life and will a ffect at least one out o f every 
five of your fam ily and friends soon.

When making your retiring and m oving d eci­
sions you ’ ll soon d iscover that you’ ve really a c ­
cumulated a lot of possessions in the last few 
years. And you’ ll quickly see that it will be very 
difficult, time consum ing and quite expensive 
to haul your possessions across the country or 
even around town.

But, you can turn these accum ulated posses­
sions into quick cash by holding an auction. A 
well planned auction can cash  out your entire 
household in just a few short hours. And, I pr<^ 
vide com plete auction serv ice  so you don ’ t 
have to worry about a single detail.

It’s a whole lot easier to have an auction and 
put cash in your wallet than it is to put your 
piano, refrigerator & hide a bed in a truck. And 
rem em ber, when it com es to buying or selling 
AUCTION’S BEST(.m)

T U C K E R  A U C T IO N  COMPANY
ROUTE 1, BOX 90 

EASTLAND, TEXAS 76446

Phoo.6Z9 1956
LiCGHSe numt>«r TXS-063 1152 MAA *npTAA

Save Work... 
Save Money

A John D ee re  rid ing  m ow er is an easy  w ay to 
take the legw ork out of law n w ork A nd if you take  
a d v a n ta g e  of the sum m er s a le  co u p o n  offer, you 
c an  save  an ad d itio n a l $ 1 0 0  or $ 1 5 0  

The $ 1 0 0  cou p o n  a p p lie s  to the 5 -h p  6 5  R ider  
w ith 2 8 -in c h  m ow er The $ 1 5 0  cou p o n  a p p lie s  to 
the 8 -h p  68  Rider, a v a ila b le  in three m o d e ls  with  
3 0 -in c h  m ow er and  recoil or e le c tric  start, or with  
3 4-in c h  m ow er and  e le c tric  start A va ila b ility  is 
lim ited  to current stock at p a rtic ip a tin g  d e a le rs  
So buy now  a n d  save both d o llars  an d  legw ork

This coupon worth $100 toward the purchase price of 
a new John Deere 65 Riding Mower or $150 toward the 
purchase price of a new John Deere 68 Riding Mower 
Cuttomar plaaaa fill In:

Nome . _  . 

Add«8$_

Town Zip

Cuttomar; Coupon void where prohibited by law Prices 
subject to change without rralice and may vary by dealer You 
are required to pay applicable sales tax on value of goods 
And you must till in your name and address in places 
provided on this coupon Otter may be withdrawn on short 
notice by John Deere

Daalar plaata lilt in:

lpl«M« prim)
N«m# __

Cod« _________

C P Acct No . _ _ . . .  ____  . _ ______ Ml

D «a l9 r: You are authorized to act as our agent for redemption 
of this coupon in accordance with the terms Ihereot Limit one 
coupon per rider Dealer must till in name and account 
number —  piesentation tor redemption without such 
compliance constitutes fraud Otter may be withdrawn on 
short notice by John Deere

COUPON MUST BE PRESENTED AT TIME OF PURCHASE. 
SELLING PRICE AND DISCOUNT MAY VARY BY DEALER. 
DEALER PAR'nCIPATINO IN DISCOUNT

I
I

J

Bramlett Implement 
Inc. Of Rising Star 

Ph: 643-4311 Mork Cooksey, Manager
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••••ATTEND THE CHURCH OF YOUR CHOICEor church services. . .
The following firms, recognizing the importance religion 
plays in our community, make this church page possible

each Sunday.

Kimbrough Funeral 
Home

300 W. 9th 442-1211

Thornton Feed Mill
1200 Conrad Hilton Ave.

We salute the following 
Ciscoans who will observe 
birthdays during the week:

A ugust 29--G ennifer 
Mahoney, Trey Kendall, 
Mike Johnson, Mrs. Floyd 
Johnson, Kenneth Campbell, 
Thelma Moore, Lou Jane 
Qualls and Mrs. Carleton 
Holder.

A ugust 30—C arolyn  
Thackerson, Frankie Joe 
Rosales, Rosa Gallegos, 
Mrs. Lane Gilmore, Mrs. 
Wesley Isenhower, Ralph T. 
Morton, C.B. Frailey, Der- 
ward Morris, Gary Deitiker,

Mrs. Mabel AlKire, Leak 
Lane, Cora Reimund, Linda 
McCanlies and C.B. Wayne.

August 3 1 -M rs . J .A . 
Jensen , Judy G raham  
H old ridge , M rs. M ack 
Smith, Mrs. Dick Thacker­
son and M rs. W inston 
Heidenheimer.

September 1-Jimmie Lee, 
Mrs. George Kinard, Mrs. 
Major Farnsworth, Ron 
V oss, M rs. H enry A. 
S chaefer, Paula Booth, 
Cheri Morgan, Mike Tucker, 
Mark Heidenheimer and Joe 
Ziehr.

S eptem ber 2—A .R . 
Westfall Sr., Lee Roy Witz- 
sche, Billy Holt, Mrs. J.C. 
Wilson, Martha Ferguson 
Westfall, Larry Elliott,, Er-

The Osco Prest
Sunday,

August 28, 1963

nie Hart, Mrs. Lillie Smith 
and Gary Watson.

September 3-M rs. Bob 
Hammett, M.L. Perdue, 
Mrs. Con Collins, Harold 
Davies, Mrs. V.H. Bosworth, 
Wayne Pryor and Elaine Mc­
Collum.

September 4-Betty Evans, 
Dizzy Howell, Mrs. E.L. 
Pugh, Mrs. John Trammell, 
Linda Jean Allen, Roy 
Cozart, Bobby Foster, Mrs. 
R.N. Sanders, Jerry Hall 
and H.E. B oyl^ .

Couples celebrating an­
niversaries during the week 
include: Mr. and Mrs. 
W inston H eidenheim er, 
August 29; Mr. and Mrs. 
Allen Jackson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Parks, August 30; Mr. 
and Mrs. Pearl Threat, 
August 31; Mr. and Mrs. 
H erm an S ch a e fer, 
September 1; and Mr. and 
M rs. John C onger, 
September 2.

I Won A t Losing
I recommend Diet Center. 

“ It’s a Natural.”

Due to revised nutritional 
attitudes toward various foods and

tKe daily counseling of tKe Diet 

Center counselors 1 Kave been

able to lose 1 9 * /4  lbs. and 22Yt"

in just 5 weeks.

T H I  N A TU R A L  W A Y
T O  L O S IW IIO N T I

_

CALL TODAY
far a frma, Introductory eonouttation.

DIET CENTER OF E A S T L A N D
Mon.-Fri. 7:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m. 703 W . Main

Sat. q;oo a m.-11:00 a.m, 8i7-6aq-836i

DIET CENTER OF BRECKENRIDGE
Mon. Fri. 7:30 a m.-2:30 p.m. ia6 E. Walker

Sat. 8:30 a.m. 12 noon 817-330-6831
Late Afternoon Appointments AvaJable

REDEEMER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Sunday School classes 
begin at 9:30 a.m. Adult Bi­
ble class will feature a 
slideshow of the Synodical 
Convention given by Mr. 
Rollins Roth. Worship Ser­
vice begins at 10:30 a.m. 
Pastor Crockett’s message 
is entitled “ The Perfect Mis­
sion Offering!”  based on 
Isaiah 66; 18-23. Pastor Lewis 
H. Wunderlich from St. John

Lutheran Church in 
Hamilton will be our Mission 
Speaker for our Mission 
Festival at 2:30 p.m.

The Cisco Care Center 
Worship Service will be on 
Wednesday at 10:00 a.m. 
Choir will be at 7:30 p.m. 
Wednesday.

Thursday, September 1 at 
9:30 a.m. Adult Information 
Session will be held in the 
Parish Hall. roAfclK?

NOTICE OF MEETING OF 
THE CISCO HOSPITAL 
DISTRICT BOARD OF 

DIRECTORS
The meeting of the Cisco 

Hospital District’s Board of 
Directors will be at 12:30 
p.m., Tuesday, August 30, 
1983, in the Community 
Room of the First National 
Bank in Cisco, 408 Conrad 
Hilton Avenue, Cisco, Texas. 
ORDER OF BUSINESS:
1. Meeting called to order.
2. Approval of minutes of 
previous meeting.
3. Unfinished Business.
4. New Business.

(a.) Public hearing on 
Budget for Fiscal Year 
1983-84.

(b.) Tax Rate Certifica­
tion.

( c . )  Nam e Bank 
Depository.

5. Executive Session.
6. Adjournment.

Emma Lee Donovan 
President of the 

Board of Directors

Onirdi Direäray
LONG BRANCH BAPTIST 

CHURCH
John Hagaa, Pastar 

11 M iles S. s f  C isca 
183-Follow Signs 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evenmg 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

blrtlB. . . . 1

CALVARY 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. Ronnie Shackelford 
Pastor

18th and Ave. D
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
7:30 p.m.

FAITH BAPTIST CHURCH 
700 West 18th 

J. Doyle Roberts, Pastor 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening Wor­
ship 7:30 p.m.

Mr. and Mrs. Danny
Hughes are proud to an­
nounce the birth of a son, 
Stephen l>ee, bom Thursday, 
August 18, 1983, at
Brow nw ood R egional 
Hospital.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Edward Wende of 
Cisco, Mr. and Mrs. Lee 
Hughes of Rising Star, and 
Marilyn Wallach of Ranger.

Stephen weighed 6 lbs. 8 
oz. at birth. He is welcomed 
home by a sister, Christy.

m
local news m brief1

FIRST UNITED 
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 

307 W. 17th S t 
Rev. Stephen F. Wheeler

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. | 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 7:00 p.m. 
Tuesday-Bible Study 7:30 
p.m.
Friday-Youth Service 7:30 

•p.m.

G REATER MOUNTAIN 
TOP UNITED PENET- 

COSTAL CHURCH 
Hwy. 183, 12 miles South of 

Cisco
P.O. Box 289 Cisco, Texas 

Pastor John C. Jones 
Phone 843-3629 Sunday 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evangelistic Services 7:00 
p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 
p.m.

CORINTH BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Cisro-Eastland Highway 
Rev. Burdltt Hitt Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Training Union 5:30 
p.m.
Sunday Evening Siervice6:30
p.m.
Wednesday Night 7:00 p.m.

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOO 
367 W. 7th St 

Phone 44M881 
Sunday School 9:45 n.m. 
Morning Worship 11:M a.m. 
Evening Worship 8:66 p.B. 
Wednesday Bible Study 7:66 
p.m.

CATHOLIC CHURCHES 
Rev. James Miller 

St. Francis, Eastland, 6:30 
p.m. Saturday.
St. Rita, Ranger, 9:45 a.m. 
Sunday
St. John Strawn, 8:00 a.m., 
Sunday
Holy Rosary, Cisco, 11:30 
a.m.Sunday

MARANATHA BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Independent 
Fundamental 

Pastor M.H. Jones 
Highway 80 West of Eastland 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Prayer Services 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Services 7:30 
p.m.

REVIVAL TABERNACLE 
Attention

Special Announcement
Sun¿iy at 1 p.m. on KERC 
Radio, Special preaching, 
annointed s inging. 
Deliverance for both soul 
and body all in the name of 
Jesus! Special prayer for the 
sick!

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. Frank Williams, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship Service 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
U.M. Women Tuesday 9:30 
a.m.

WESLEY UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. Frank WUliams, Pastor 
Ave. A

Morning Worship 9:00 a.m. 
Church School 10:00 a.m. 
Family Night 4th Thursday 
each month.
A dm in istrative  Board 
Meeting: 1st Monday Night 
Each Month.

FIRE AT SCHOOL 
Cisco volunteer firemen 

went to Intermediate School 
at 5:40 p.m. Tuesday when 
an exhaust fan caught fire in 
a rest room, Fire Chief C.W. 
Guthrie reported. An elec­
trical short probably caused 
the blaze, the chief said. 
Damage was minor.

GREATER ST. MARK 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. J.C. Mills, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Service 
7:00 p.m.

FOURTH STREET 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Sunday 10:30 a.m. 
Evening 5:00 p.m.

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 
CHURCH 

SOO W. 6th St.
Rev. William C. Weeks 

Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m.

Men In Service

ARMY AND AIR FORCE 
HOMETOWN NEWS-Staff 
Sgt. Mark A. Lawless, son ot 
Glen D. and Nancy L. 
Lawless of Rural Route 2, 
Cisco, Texas, has graduated 
from the U.S. Army com­
puter repair course at Fort 
Gordon, Ga.

He is a 1972 graduate of 
Fountain  V alley  High 
School, Calif.

CHURCH OF 
THE NAZARENE 
W. 10th and Ave. N 

Rev. C.L. Reneau, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
7:30 p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Buddy Sipe 

Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Church Training 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
W ednesday: M id-W eek 
Prayer Meeting 7:00 p.m.

CHURCH OF GOD 
Seventh Day 

Romney Community 
South of Cisco

Worship: 11:00 a.m. Satur­
day
Telephone 442-3962

THE LANDMARK 
APOSTOUC 

469 W. nth street 
Rev. Jay Williams. Pastor 

Thursday Night 7:30 p.m. 
Saturday Night Youth Ser­
vice 7:30 p.m.
Sunday Morning at 10:00
a.m.
Sunday Night at 7:00 p.m. 
442-4177

FIRST EVANGELICAL 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. John W. Clinton, Pastor 
Highway 80 West 

Across From Hospital 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Hour of Power in 
Prayer 7:30 p.m.

EAST CISCO BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

566 E. nth
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Training Union 5:30 p.m. 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m. 
M id-W eek S e rv ice s : 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

you w a n t«  
you want 
dassifieds

Praise be for 
the NURSE

It’s the nurse who usually gives the 
last comforts to the dying patient 
. . . and often to the family. She is 
very important to the care-giving staff. 
Much is owed to her by many.

A
dKk.

 ̂ CISCO FUNERAL HOME
^ O w n e d  & Oparalad by #ta A.B. Chambars Family

j d L
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CISCO CHURCH 
OF CHRIST 

Jim Hatcher, Minister 
1-20 North AcceM Road at 

Ave. N
Sunday Bible Classes 9:30
a.m.
Worship Service 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Services 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday, Mid-Week Ser­
vice 7:30 p.m.
Ladies 10:00 a.m. Tuesday

INSPIRATION CHURCH 
OF GOD

Rev. Larry Smith 
Camp InspiratioD-Box 167 

Eastland, Texas 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Service 7:00

CHURCH OF JESUS 
CHRIST OF LATTER DAY 

SAINTS
Opening Exercises 9:30 a.m. 
Primary 9:30-11:10 a.m. 
Priesthood 9:30-10:20 a.m. 
Relief Society 9:30-10:20 
a.m.
Sunday School 10:30-11:10 
a.m.
S acram en t S e rv ice : 
11:20-12:30

HOLY TRINITY 
EPISCOPAL CHURCH 

S. Seaman 
Eastland, Texas 

The Rev. John A. Hohnes 
Holy Communion 11:00 a.m.

PLEASANT HILL BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Pleasant HID Community 
8 miles Sooth of Cisco 

A.G. Purvis, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 5:30 p.m.

p.m.

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Fundamental 

Ave. E. at I7th St 
Rev. Larry Sowels 
Surtday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Worship Service 
7:30 p.m.

REDEEMER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Rev. Dell J. Crockett, Pastor 
Ave. D and East 18th

Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Worship Service 10:30 a.m.

M ITCHELL BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Joe Phllpott, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Preaching 10:45 a.m.
Sunday Night 7:00 p.m. 
Prayer Service Wednesday 
8:00 p.m.

P R IM IT IV E  BAPTIST 
CHURCH

James E. Robertson Jr., 
Minister

Services 2nd Sunday each 
month
Singing 10:30 a.m.
Preaching 11:00 a.m.

FIRST CHRISTIAN 
CHURCH

Milo Steffen, Minister
Church School 9:40 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Bible Study 8:30 p.m.

FAITH CHAPEL FULL 
GOSPEL CHURCH 

366 West llth 
Rev. James Harris 

9:45 a.m. Sunday 
7:00 p.m. Sunday 
7:30 p.m. Wednesday

WORD FAITHOF LIFE 
CENTER

Comer of East 7th k  Ave. A
Sunday Morning 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evening 7:00 p.m. 
Thursday Evening 7:00 p.m.

GOSPEL ASSEM BUr 
MI6 Ave. A. aad East IMh 

Cari Begley-illBiBisr 
Bible Teachbig Subject To 
Question And Children’s 
Church Sunday 8:10 p.m . 
Worriiip Service TiHrsday ft 
Saturday 7:30 p.m .
Spedai M ode ft Stngliic All 
Services

Ì
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THE CISCO Girl Scout 
House, which was damaged 
in a fire last Tuesday night, 
might well be considered for 
a Christmas in May project 
by the community. That’s an 
idea that Fire Chief C.W. 
Guthrie submits.

The building loss was part­
ly covered by insurance. If a 
lot of folks rolled up their 
sleeves, took their hammers 
and saws and went to work 
the building could probably 
be restored with the money 
from the insurance buying 
materials, Mr. CWG says.

The loss included a piano. 
Let’s all think about Mr. 
CWG’s idea and tell the 
Chamber of Commerce what 
we think of it.

LAST WEDNESDAY was 
the birthday of Mr S. Lopes, 
long-time good citizen who 
suffered a stroke a year of so 
ago, and the Cisco Lions 
Gub prepared a birthday 
greeting card at their lun­
cheon Wednesday noon. 
Four Lions -  Jasper Cook, 
C.B. Dill, J.C. Flethcer and 
E.L. Jackson -  took the 
envelope with the card and 
goodly number of green bills 
out to the Lopez house after 
the luncheon.

They found .Mr. SP, who 
served several years as the 
club’s tailtwister, in front of 
the television watching ma­
jor league baseball. He can’t 
talk but there was no doubt 
that his appreciation came 
from  the heart, Lions 
reported

MR EARL RAY of Ray- 
Ram. Inc., local machine 
shop, has his good right hand 
in a heavy cast. Last Satur­
day, his hand got into a 
machine of some sort and he 
lost the third finger of the 
hand and had other bruises... 
The honorable Jack Farleigh 
celebrated birthday number 
83 on Thrusday and he’s 
looking forward to many 
more...Mrs James Cotton 
went off to Childress last 
Monday to visit home folks 
and left Mr JC in charge of 
the photography studio and 
so forth... Mrs. Mariam 
B led soe , loca l retired  
teacher, recently enjoyed a 
vacation trip out west.

THANKS TO Dr Chief 
Brown, airplanes dropping 
in at the Cisco Municipal Air­
port will soon be able to buy 
gasoLne. The Pnde Com­
pany of Abilene is installing 
aviation gasoline service 
equipment there A 20-key 
computer arrangement will 
permit local pilots to obtain 
a key and service their own 
aircraft.

Dr Brown, who has a nice 
hangar for his airplane at 
the airport, will have a 
special key that itinerary 
airplanes can borrow, fill up 
their tanks and pay him. And 
Dr. Brown will pay Pnde 
Dr. Brown’s contributions to 
the airport program have 
been very substantial over a 
good many years.

THE CITY’S OIL income 
for the year has now passed 
$52.000! A check for some

Q/obituafies..1

Service§ For 
S.E. Parkinson 
Are Pending

Funeral s e rv ice s  for 
Samuel Ernest Parkinson,
85, E astland County- 
Precinct 4 Constable, are 
pending at K im brough 
Funeral Home 

Mr. Parkinson died Thurs­
day afternoon at his home 

A former Cisco police 
chief, Parkinson had served 
as constable since 1972.

$12,000 came in this month to 
raise the total, reports Gty 
Manager Mike Moore. So 
far, the oil royalty income 
has gone into a special 
fund...The big rain last week 
came at a good time for the 
city to see what’s needed in 
the way of drainage on Front 
Street, Mr. Moore reports. 
The street’s base has been 
put in and plans call for pav­
ing soon. Plans call for it to 
be completed before the first 
home football game...Street 
seal coating work slowed 
down somewhat after the 
ram as city crews had to 
take equipment to gravel 
streets.

HOW IS MRS. Harold Adl- 
ing getting along in recover­
ing from a stroke' Thanks to 
the West Texas Rehab folks, 
she now gets about with a 
cane and won high score at a 
bridge party the other day. 
Mr. HA takes her to WTR 
Center reg u la rly  for 
trea tm en ts ...T h e  Jay 
Richardsons have new con­
crete sidewalks and street 
curbs around their home at 
Ave. N and 13th Street... We 

’ can’t remember when Mrs. 
W.M. Joyner and Mrs. 
I.ouise Allison have missed a 
meeting of the City Council... 
Our scouts report that Mrs. 
George Ruppert of 707 West 
7th Street is planning to 
move to the Fort Worth- 
Dallas area to be near two 
daughters

MET UP WITH Mr. Joe 
Cortez of Haskell in town the 
other afternoon. Joe used to 
work for Heidenheimer's in 
Cisco and now is a partner in 
the Heidenheimer store at 
H askell... Miss M arcia 
Glenn, who works for Litton 
Industries in Germany, is 
due September 13th for a 
visit of two or three weeks 
with her parents, the Ralph 
Glenns... There’s a golf 
scramble tournament this 
Saturday afternoon at the 
Cisco Country Club.

THE LLOYD Londons are 
back home m Cisco after 
3,000 miles of vacation travel 
and, he says, it’s nice to get 
home so he’ll have time to 
rest before returning to his 
desk at Kamon House on 
Monday.

The Londons went to Min­
neapolis where he attended a 
reunion of his old Navy unit. 
He noted that it's incredible 
how much older some his old 
friends look... The Londons 
went to Fort Collins. Colo., to 
attend the wedding of a 
neice.

MRS STERUNG Drum- 
wright of our town scored an 
incredible 9,000 points at a 
bridge party last Wednesday 
afternoon. The ladies played 
five rounds Mrs. SD had two 
slams in one round. She won 
high score, as you can im­
agine... At the grocery store 
the other day, Mr E.L. 
Jackson saw Bruce Smith 
with a baby in a shopping 
cart. And a few minutes 
later, he saw both of them 
with their twins -  which he 
didn’t know about until then.

Griegs School 
Reunion Set

The Griggs School Reu­
nion will be held on Sunday, 
September 4, in the Senior 
Citizens Center at Rising 
Star

Lunch will beat 12:30p.m 
People attending are asked 
to bring a covered dish. 

Everyone is welcome. 
.Mildred. Edith L  Lillian

August 31 - CJC registration.
September 1 - CJC registration; Chamber of Commerce 

breakfast at White Elephant, 7:00 a.m .
September 2 • Cisco Loboes VS DeLeon at DeLeon.
September 2 • Classes begin at CJC.
September S • Labor Day, Splash Day at Swimming Pool. 

(Free Swimming)
September $ -  Chamber of Conunerce Board Meeting at 

2:00.
September • - Cisco Loboes VS Haskell at Cisco.
September 13 • City Cooactl Meeting, 7:00 p.m.
September M • Cisco Loboes VS Seymour at Seymour.
September 17 • CJC VS Henderson at Cisco, 7:30.
September 10 • 2$ - LaJet Classic Tickets on sale at 

Chamber of Commerce.
Septem ber S  • CJC VS Tarleton at Cisco at 7:30.
S e ^ m b ar IS • Claco Leboea VS Wlatcra at Winters (First 

game af District F lay).
Septem ber t l  • City Coaacfl Meeting 7:00 p.m.

Sixty-four hospital gowns, 
colorful, attractive, neatly 
pressed and folded, were 
sent this week to the M.D. 
Anderson H ospital and 
Tumor Institute (University 
of Texas Systems Cancer 
Center) by the Cisco Chapter

of AARP.

Eight AARP members had 
met in the home of Mrs. Lou 
Schlurpo, Chairman of the 
Community Service Com­
mittee, to cut, sew and 
transform discarded men’s

Public Invited To 
Ground Breaking

Representatives from all 
departments of the con­
gregation will take part in 
ground breaking ceremonies 
for the new addition to the 
First Christian Church at 
12:15 a.m. Sunday just west 
of the church building, it was 
announced by the Rev. Milo 
Steffen, pastor.

The ceremonies will follow 
the regular morning service 
where the Dr. Earl Bissex of 
Abilene, area minister of 
Christian churches, will 
preach.

Re v. Steffen will preside at 
the ground breaking, and Dr. 
Bissex will take part along 
with Standlee McCracken, 
chairman of the building 
com m ittee ; Mrs. Ruth 
Powell, president of the 
CWF; Don Reynolds, presi­
dent of CMF; Mrs. Pat

Moore, representing the 
apostles; Mrs. Olga Fay 
Parker, representing the 
trustees; Lynn Williams, 
building committee; Lori 
Ann S peegle , Youth 
Fellowship; Rachel Maples, 
JYF: and Steve Cozart, the 
contractor.

Members of Sunday School 
Classes will also be on hand 
to assist. Rev. Steffen said.

The 3,200 square foot addi­
tion on the west side of the 
church will contain five new 
class rooms, a youth ac­
tivities room, a utility room 
for women workers, rest 
rooms and the like. The pro­
ject represents an invest­
ment of about $100,000.

Rev. Steffen invited the 
public to attend the morning 
service and the ground 
breaking.

Mountain Top Church 
Will Host Missionaries

Pastor John C. Jones and 
G reater M ountain Top 
Church announces m is­
sionary Ted Purcell and 
family will be ministering in 
word and relating activities 
of the wonderful progress be­
ing made in the work in 
Brazil Sunday at 6:30 p.m.

After having spent seven 
months in Brazil on a secular 
job assignment. Ted Purcell 
felt God calling him to a mis­
sionary ministry to that 
country. Reverend Fhircell

D r i n k i n g

D r i v i n g

D e a t h

A Combination we 
CAN T LIVE WITH'

returned to the states, where 
in September 1977, he receiv­
ed his missionary appoint­
ment.

The P u rce lls , Ted, 
Charlotte, and Mollie, arriv­
ed in Brazil and UPCI mis­
sionaries in November, 1978. 
They spent several months 
in Campinas studying the 
Portuguese language. After 
a cq u irin g  a w orking 
knowledge of the language, 
they set about establishing 
new works in Campianas. 
They have built two new 
church buildings and are 
seeing the rewards of their 
labors in this city.

The public is invited to 
hear this outstanding mis­
sionary family Sunday at 
6:30 p.m. The church is 
located 10 miles south of 
Cisco on Hwy. 183.
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These are no ordin a^ jeans 
They re Sedgefield The  jeans 
made with a fit especially for the 
man. with slightly fuller seat and 
thigh for comfort These jeans are 
made out of comfortable 100*. 
cotton Do-Nothing* denim that 
will keep its fit and won t wrinkle 
either They II make you look 
terrific No matter what you re 
doing Get Sedgefieid Jeans 
For the physical fit
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T H E  M A N 'S  STORE' C i l

J&dgefield

shirts into these hospital 
gowns. These members 
were: Clara White, Pearl 
Trapp, Jo Phillips, Alta 
Strickland, Sue Taylor, Rose 
Knowlden and Dixie Mon­
tgomery. Donors of the 
shirts were many, and to 
them the Chapter expresses 
appreciation.

Front facings, collars, 
lapels and pockets are 
removed from the shirts and 
long sleeves are shortened. 
The neckline or yoke is 
rounded out; the shirt is 
reversed; all edges are 
bounded with colorful tape. 
Two ties of tape - one at the 
back neckline and one below 
- complete the garment.

This is not the first project 
for the M.D. Anderson In­
stitute. In 1982, under the 
Chairmanship of Mrs. Ger­
trude Besselaar, the Com­
munity Service Committee 
and helpers made and sent 
forty-two caps for patients 
who have undergone treat­
ment resulting in loss of 
hair. Mrs. Besselaar has 
since died - a victim of 
cancer.

According to Mrs. Schlur-

A.A.R.P, MEMBERS who helped to ready 64 hospital gowns for ship­
ment to M.D. Anderson Hospital and Tumor Institute are shown in the 
above photo. They are (left to right) Jo Phillips, Alta Strickland, Sue 
Taylor, Pearl Trapp and Lou Schlurpo. Not shown are Dixie Mon­
tgomery, Clara White and Rose Knowlden. (staff photo)

po, the Community Service 
Committee will now proceed 
with the project of laprobes

Party Will Open The 
Kingdom Kids Sessions

Kingdom Kids I and II, an 
i n t e r d e n o m i n a t i o n a l  
organization, will resume 
sessions on Sept. 13, 1983. 
Kingdom Kids I and II pro­
vide Christian education and 
fellowship.

Kingdom Kids I meets at 
First United Methodist 
Church, each Tuesday, from 
2:45-4:00, involving children 
ages four thru 2nd grade.

Kingdom Kids II meets at

First Evangelical Methodist 
Church, each Tuesday, from 
3:30-5:00, involving children 
in grades three thru six.

Church vans will provide 
transportation from  the 
schools to the churches. Per­
mission slips will be re­
quired.

For information concern­
ing KKI, please call 442-1334.

For information concern­
ing KKII, please call 442-1875 
or 442-2486.

for residents of the Nursing 
Center. This has been an on­
going project and has includ­
ed footlets, also.

Other AARP service pro­
grams have been the dona­
tion of eye-glasses to the 
Lions Club glasses collec­
tion, crib sheets for the Child 
Care Center, Christmas 
baskets to Cisco needy 
families, monetary contribu­
tions to various organiza­
tions, all in keeping with the 
AARP national and local 
purpose of Service to its 
members and Service to all

others. Driver improvement 
classes have continued and 
announcement has been 
made that the Tax Aid Pro­
gram started last year will 
be repeated.

Visitors and prospective 
m em bers are a lw ays 
w elcom e to the AARP 
regular meetings on the 
third Thursday of each 
month at the Corral Room. 
The covered dish supper 
begins at 6:00 p.m., followed 
by a social or educational 
program. Walter Knowlden 
is president.

David
Callarman
Insurance

LIf« ■ Fir« • Auto 
Hoapllalliatlon ■ Liability 

Tax Shaltorod Savings 
Disability Incorna

DEE WILSON
Associate

OHica 
707 Ava. D 
442-1498

Cisco. Texas 76437
Home

1704 Ave. N 
442-3601

COAL/WOOD STOVE AND INSERT
Get Ready For Winter

f9icuu o f tStciKi 
f4Ĉ  ĉ tnjnià cSticet

Cuco, 'Jexat 76437 
(817) 442-306S

Rom & Charlotte Honea 
P-89 (dealers I

Frm jTan't-nn Siov«
E WORLD'S FINEST STOVE

TTTTT
STOVE V

Introducing the Opening of

M & M Texaco
Under the M onagm en t of 

Randy M cCoy

We have:

E. 1-20 & R ising Star Hwy.

New & used tires

Full line of pickup & 
cur accessories

Oil Changes & grease jobs 

Hand washes & Hand wax jobs

Full service for Senior Citizens at 

Self Service Pumps

Mechanic on duty

24hr. Wrecker Service 

Small Shop Welding

Nights: 442-4217Day: 442-3556

I


