
Holl Of Remarks
by Htrrtl Hdbnarki

THIS WEEK makes you 
ieci like you have spring 
(e v e r , since afternoon 
temperatures on Monday 
crawled up into the 70s. 
Tuesday afternoon highs 
were predicted for the 70s 
and so were Wednesdays.

I could get used to this kind 
of weather reai quick, ft is 
nice to be able to go outside 
and do something without 
being so cold.

Norm ally I like cold 
weather, but I am ready (or 
the spring to begin and stay 
around for awhile. The past 
few  days have been 
beautiful.

IF YOU ARE considering 
buying a used car, the 
following information might 
be of interest, especially if 
you are going to purchase it 
out of town.

Good used cars are hard to 
find these days, but you’ re 
really better off asking some 
simple questions before you 
buy, advises Rod Birm­
ingham, an investigator with 
Aetna Life & Casualty’s ar- 
son/fraud unit.

That used car may look 
great, but a second look -  
and knowing what to look for 
-  ran mean the difference 
between having the car you 
want and having nothing but 
an empty wallet.

The car could have been 
stolen, Birmingham warns. 
Even if you don’t know it’s a 
stolen car, you can lose the 
car, and the money you paid 
for it.

“ Of course you can always 
sue the seller if you unknow­
ingly purchased a stolen 
car,’ ’ he adds, “ but that’s 
likely to be a lengthy and ex­
pensive process, and it cer­
tainly won’ t save you any 
money!

“ Auto theft is a big 
business these days. 
Whether it’s chopping up 
stolen cars for body repair 
parts or placing a stolen car 
body on a chassis for which 
there is legitimate title, pro­
fessional auto thieves are 
making money,’ ’ B irm ­
ingham explains. “ And the 
uimlttlng used car kuyer, on 
the other hand, eould lose 
money on what at first ap­
pears to be a redl bargain.’ ’ 

So if you’re in the market 
for a go4>d used car or expect 
to be in the future, Birm­
ingham offers these tips:

Go to a reliable, establish­
ed dealer when buying a us­
ed car. Be especially careful 
when buying a car from an 
individual without a specific 
address. Check to see 
whether the seller can be 
located should you need to 
reach him or her after the 
sale.

Check the Vehicle Iden­
tification Number (V IN ), 
which is usually embossed 
on a metal plate over the 
driver's dash section and 
visible from the outside of 
the bottom of the windshield, 
for signs of alteration or 
replacement. The VIN must 
match the VIN shown on the 
seller's certificate of title.

Inquire about past in­
surance and financing on the 
car, and then verify this in­
formation with the insurance 
agent, bank or finance com­
pany.

Look at the body paint on a 
new model. A fresh paint job

may Indicate cover-up work 
by thieves.

Check the license tag and 
inspection sticker to be cer­
tain that they are current 
and issued by the same 
state.

Ask lor at least one set of 
the original manufacturer’s 
keys rather than a replace­
ment set. Be suspicious if the 
seller provides you with re­
made keys lor a late model 
car.

Review and complete all 
paperwork at the time of 
sale. Don’t forget that cer­
tificate of titles frequently 
can be counterfeited. Check 
documents carefully for 
signs of possible alteration.
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Police Chief Warns March 1 st Is Deodline For Making
vtoirteVoHtaSce Application For 'Christmas In May'

*  ■ W w B e®  w W w  ___  _________  TKo MiriianH nrft. rommittee of the Droicct. Forms for ap

Cisco’s Acting Chief of 
Police Raymond Blevins 
stated here this week that 
citizens are violating a city 
ordinance by parking their 
automobiles in alleyways.

The blocked alleys cause 
city sanitation crews pro­
blems when picking up gar­
bage. They are sometimes 
unable to pass through the 
alleys, according to Chief 
Blevins.

An ordinance was passed 
on January 9th, 1973, dealing 
with the parking of cars in 
alleyways. The ordinance 
was passed as an emergency 
and went into effect im­
mediately. Douglas Fry was

mayor and Sutton Crofts was 
city secretary at the time.

The ordinance reads in 
part as follows;

“ It shall be, and it is 
hereafter, unlawful for any 
person or persons to park or 
leave unattended any motor 
vehicle in or on any alley 
located in the City of Cisco.

“ Any person, firm, part­
nership or corporation who 
violates any provision of this 
ordinance or fails to comply 
with any of its provisions 
shall be deemed guilty of a 
misdemeanor upon convic­
tion thereof, shall be punish­
ed by a fine of not less than 
$10.00 or more than $100.00.”

March 1,1982, has been set 
as the deadline for making 
app lication  fo r the 
“ Christmas in May”  pro­
gram, which is being spon­
sored by the Cisco Chamber

Firemen Answer 
Alarm For Small 
Grass Fire Mon.

Firemen answered a fire 
alarm Monday afternoon. It 
was a small grass fire at 403

East 14th There was not 
much dam age, it was 
reported.

of Commerce.
The program has been set 

up for community improve­
ment and is patterned after a 
sim ilar program called 
“ Christmas in April”  in

Midland. The Midland pro­
gram has been in existence 
since October, 1973.

Applications will be check­
ed and visits to the sites will 
be visited by the Selection

Hospital Auxiliary 
Installs Officers

Lake Cisco Park Miniature Golf 
Course Cleaned Up By Volunteers

After many weeks of bad 
weather and very slow pro­
gress on renovation of the 
Ijike Cisco Park Miniature 
9plf Course, several young 
people, stating  th at thay  
wanted to do something for 
C isco, o ffe red  their 
assistance in cleaning up 
and renovating the Golf 
Course.

The young men from the 
Athletic Dorm at Cisco 
Junior College were Doug 
Nettles, Lee Jordan, Mike 
Julian, Jeff Osborn, Greg 
Sturm, and Curtis Williams. 
Other young men helping 
were Bobby Ingram, Jr., 
Randy Ingram and Randy 
Batteas. Maunia Copeland 
and Richard Chamness were 
also on hand helping out.

Mrs. S tan ley P ir t le  
prepared lunch consisting of 
pinto beans, stew, corn 
bread, and peach cobbler. 
These dishes along with iced 
tea and coffee were served in 
the park.

Most all debris, grass, 
weeds, and old carpeting 
have been removed. Post 
holes have been dug and 
posts w ill be set next 
weekend for the six-foot 
chain link fence.

At present, the project is 
running about two weeks 
behind schedule. However, 
with good weather and the

extra help being received, 
the project should be back on 
schedule within two weeks. 
Work is planned for each 
Saturday afternoon, weather 
permltung, until the project 
is completed.

Plans call for completion

in April with an opening date 
set for April 24 and operation 
to continue through Labor 
Day of each year. The 
operating staff will be made 
up of jWftng people from this
area desiring  sum m er
employment.

CJC Basketball Teams 
Have Two Games Left

BRANDON LOY HOOD
Rev and Mrs. John Hood 

announce the birth of a son, 
Brandon Loy Hood, born 
February 6 at 3:05 p.m. in 
E .L. Graham Memorial 
Hospital. He weighed eight 
pounds and 15 ounces, and 
was 22 inches long. Maternal 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Orvil Rawlinson of Fort 
Worth. Paternal grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Hood of Fort Worth. 
Great-grandmother is Mrs. 
Evie Corley of Sacul.

LOBO It J.R.’s 
Family Hair Care 
Precision cuts, perms- 
seta-eolor. Full Service 
(or the whole family. 
442-4979 or 442-3551, 709 
Ave. D, Cisco. 
p-15

CISCO KID 
CAR WASH 

Ird St. and Ave. E 
■Where Most People 
Wash. Wash your veae-1 
Oan blinds, throw i

JAMES LANDON 
HAMILTON JR.

Mr and Mrs. James I.an- 
don Hamilton Sr. wish to an­
nounce the birth of their 
baby boy, James I.andon 
Hamilton Jr., who was born 
February 8, at 5:00 a m. in 
Eastland M em oria l 
Hospital. He weighed six 
pounds and six ounces, and 
was 18 inches long. Maternal 
grandparents are Raymond 
and Gethra Moon Stuart of 
Scranton. Paternal grand­
parents are Howard and 
Jackie Hamilton and Carl 
Tabor. Maternal great­
grandmother is Mrs. R.L. 
Moon Sr. of Nimrod. Pater­
nal great-grandfather is 
Jack Rawson. Godparents 
are Roland and Donna 
Owens.

V V ( ) R I ) o f ( ; O D

Therefore came I 
forth to meet thee, 
diligently to seek 
thy face, and I have 
found thee.

Proverbi 7:15

Whoever said that hard 
works pays off must be wat­
ching the Cisco Junior Col­
lege Lady Wranglers during 
their workouts.

I think the one that is pro­
udest of them and feels that 
some of the nicest people she 
has ever met belong to the 
CJC Lady Wranglers basket­
ball team, is the team’s 
manager ( who also happens 
to be the one who is writing 
this!)

If you happen to see Coach 
David I jn d  sometime, ask 
him how his team is doing, 
he’ll be glad to tell you. Bet­
ter yet, why not come see the 
team in action. The season is 
closing fast with two more 
home games. Games are 
scheduled for February 18 
when the Wranglers will 
take on Weatherford College 
at 6:00 p.m. with the men’s 
game following at 8:00 p.m. 
The last game of the season

First Industrial 
Arts Club To 
Meet Thursday

The First Industrial Arts 
Club will meet at the 
Women’s Club House at 2:00 
p.m. Thursday, February 18.

Mayor Eris Ritchie will 
speak on • Critical Areas in 
Our Community,”  in which 
people must become involv­
ed.

Guests are welcome and 
all members are urged to at­
tend.

Pleasant Hill 
Homemakers Club 
Meets Feb. 11th

The Pleasant Hill Exten­
sion Homemakers Club met 
Thursday, Feb. 11, at 1 p.m. 
at the home of Ruthie Keyes.

There were 11 members 
and one guest present.

The program on “ Shaping 
Up Sensibly”  was given by 
Mrs Vergie Hale.

Read the claaaifick*

will be against Cooke here at 
CJC gym. For the women 
Wranglers, the final game 
against Cooke is a must to 
win. Cooke is the only team 
in our conference to beat us, 
and that was just lost by one 
point! We can’t let that hap­
pen again can we? So please 
show some support and be at 
the CJC gym February 18 
and February 25 at 6; 00 p.m. 
and 8:00 p.m. I ’ ll be the one 
dishing out water and the 
one yelling the loudest.

See ya there!

Pickup Totaled 
In Accident On 
IH-20 Near City

A pickup truck with 
camper was a total loss in an 
accident at 7:10 a.m. Satur­
day, Feb. 13, one-tenth of a 
mile west of Cisco on IH-20. 
Mr. and Mrs. J e ffre y  
Spencer and their two 
children were in the truck en 
route to his Navy base at San 
Diego, Calif.

Public Safety Trooper 
Steve Tone said that Mrs. 
Spencer, 27, was driving 
when the westbound pickup 
hit a culvert on the right side 
of the highway. The pickup 
over-turned three times, he 
said, but landed upright in 
the outside highway lane.

Mrs. Spencer, who com­
plained of chest pains, was 
admitted to E.L. Graham 
Memorial Hospital but later 
released. A Ted & Rex Fields 
wrecker brought the pickup 
to Cisco. Mr. Spencer rented 
a U-Haul truck and departed 
late in the day with the 
pickup in tow.

The Spencers planned to 
return to Winchester, Ky., 
where he expected to leave 
his wife and children with 
her parents until he could fly 
to San Diego, report to the 
Navy and arrange housing.

Trooper Tone said the 
camper shell had to be left at 
the wreck site while the 
pickup was being towed to 
town, and when the wrecker 
returned for the shell it was 
gone.

Officers for the coming 
year were presented at the 
regular meeting of the E.L. 
Graham Memorial Hospital 
Auxiliary Monday afternoon 
at the hospital.

Officers elected for 1982-83 
were as follows; Ilene Cot­
ton, p res iden t; Louise 
Anderson , Ruth
Heidenheimer, Lois Adling 
and Polly Wright, vice 
presidents; Dorcas Sitton, 
secretary; Wilma Waters, 
treasu rer; and Rachel 
Sm ith, h istorian  and 
parliamentarian.

The officers were installed 
by Hellen Hathaway. Mrs. 
Hathaway reported that 
Auxiliary members »»••*« 
contributed a total of 15,789 
hours and 40 minutes since 
the organization was found­
ed. Total hours of volunteer 
work in 1981 amounted to 
1,113 hours and 45 minutes 
with 167 workers involved.

City Manager Mike Moore 
spoke to the group, outlining 
the City of Cisco’s plans for 
improving its water and 
sewer systems. Helen Orr, 
acting administrator of the 
hospital, spoke briefly to 
report on activities at the 
hospital.

It was announced that the 
hospital will have a booth 
with a staff to take blood 
pressure at the 1982 Folk 
Life Festival. This service 
will be provided without 
charges.

S erv ic e  bars were 
presented as follows: In- 
agene Addy, 750 hours of 
volunteer service; Betty Fee 
Drumwright, 500 hours; Pat 
Isbell, 500 hours; and Wilma 
Waters, 100 hours.

Pat Wallace and Beverly 
Moore were reported as new 
members It was announced 
that 1982-83 dues are now 
payable -  $3 for active 
membership, and $5 for a 
sustaining membership. 
Ruth Heidenheimer will be 
accepting dues payments, it 
was reported.

M esdam es K itty  Mc­

Cracken, Ruth
Heidenheimer and Pat Isbell 
served as the nominating 
cwnmittee for new officers.

Committee of the project, 
according to Dr. Norman E. 
Wallace, chairman of the 
project.

The Selection Committee, 
whose chairman is Red 
Honea, encourages people to 
submit applications -  for 
their own homes or for a 
neighbor’s (with their con­
sent) or friend’s home. A 
surveying team will then 
visit the homes to help deter­
mine what repairs will be 
needed to help renovate the 
home. Pictures will be taken 
of the home selected and an 
information packet for 
volunteers will be prepared.

Big Crowd Applauds 
7th Nostalgia Night

A capacity crowd attended 
the second performance of 
the Cisco Junior College 
Stage Band in their 7th an­
nual Nostalgia Night pro­
gram at the Laguna Roof 
Garden last Saturday night. 
TTie tniUai performMvca wax 
staged Feb. 5th and the se­
cond, scheduled for Feb. 6th, 
was postponed due to bad 
weather.

The band, assisted by a 
six-girl team of Wrangler 
Belles and several featured 
numbers, gave a two hour 
program of music that was 
popular in the area 15 to 35 
years ago. The band was 
directed by Tim Jones, C JC  
band supervisor, who also 
acted as m aster of 
ceremonies.

Special numbers included 
Pat Owens, director of the 
Belles, in several solo 
numbers; Mr. Jones, who 
played “ Sugar Blues”  as a 
trumpet solo; Richard Bar­
ron of Bay City, steel 
guitarist; Tony Gilchrist of 
Ab ilen e, country and 
western soloist; and a vocal 
trio composed of Mark 
Briles of Arlington, Ben 
Hubert of San Saba and Ran­
dy Fry of Goldthwaite.

The sextet of Belles 
presented in several dance 
routines was composed of 
Misses Toni Allen, Debbie 
Edgar, Jamie Hurley, Candy 
Lcwallen, Sareta Spratt and 
Kim Richardson

Members of the band are 
Richard Barron, Gordon 
Carlisle, Brenda Carroll, 
Steve Contreras, Randy 
Finch, Randy Fry, Lupe

Gonzales, Mike Gudan, 
Rocky Harris, Scott Helton, 
Ben Hubert, Mike Keating, 
Mike McCormick, Christina 
Offringa, Tracy Owens, Mit- 
chall Parr. Jim ia PAU, 
Twyla Pearce, Greg Qualls, 
Louisa Sepeda, A rlieta  
Thomas, Danny Yates and 
Samm Ynostrosa.

The program  was a 
presentation of the Fine Arts 
Department of CJC. Wyley 
M. Peebles is chairman of 
the department. The dinner 
was catered by ARA Ser­
vices, Inc., contractors for 
the CJC cafeteria.

The program was a good 
success from all standpoints.

Forms for applications 
may be picked up at the 
Chamber of Commerce of­
fice and may be returned 
there when completed. Per­
sons must be 60 years old, 
disabled or handicapped and 
have a limited uicome to be 
eligible.

rhe project has received 
donations in cash amounting 
to $1,100 thus far. but more 
will te  sought. The commit­
tee is also asking for 
volunteers for the work 
force. Each person may 
donate eight hours of his 
time to the project, or may 
donate materials which can 
be used in the restoration.

Cash donations already 
received include $100 from 
D.D. Williams, $200 from the 
CJC Women’s Qub, $500 
from the Cisco Service Qub 
and $300 from the Cisco Dvic 
l>eague.

In addition, materials 
donations have already been 
prom ised from  Charles 
P reston  and Rudolph 
Schaefer (paint), and from 
Debbie Whitley and Sherrie 
Wright (wallpaper).

Among the needs are tools, 
tran sporta tion , paint, 
lumber, sheetrock-anything 
which can be used to 
remodel the home selected 
(or the project.

Anyone in terested  in 
donating material may call 
the Chamber office and so­
meone will pick up the 
material.

An account has been set at 
the First National Bank in 
Cisco to handle donations for 
the project.

Clark Memorial Fund 
Contributions increose

Contributions to the John 
Clark Memorial Fund are 
coming in great numbers, of­
ficials report.

Mr. Clark was killed in a 
truck accident near here 
recently when he, in a split- 
second, veered the truck to 
avoid hitting walking school 
children, a stopped school 
bus and a car stopped for the 
bus.

He is survived by some 
five children, and a number 
here have banned together to 
launch the fund with the 
view of setting up a scholar­
ship fund for the children.

Justice of the Peace I.W. 
Ussery has announced that 
gifts may be left at his cour­

troom at the Courthouse and 
the various financial institu­
tions throughout the county 
are accepting gifts which 
will be directed to the John 
Clark Memorial Fund, set up 
at Eastland National Bank.

A generous gift from the 
Elastland Goodfellcws open­
ed the new account.

Total so far is about $500.00 
it was reported and con­
tributors will be listed unless 
they p re fer to remain 
anonymous.

President Dick Wooley of 
the First National Bank in 
C isco au thorized  the 
newspaper to state that the 
bank would be glad to accept 
gifts for the fund.

4!ADbodfeS by Borry M cW illia m s
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TRADE on RENT THROUGH THE

Thursday, February 18, 1982

every Time
vou use the 

want Ads

JUST CALL \
442-2244 j

Hove something to buy or sell? One 0
* phone coll to us is like dioling 
^  our entire circulotion.. .person-to- jc  m 

person! Ploce your Wont Ad todoy!

I  Political
I  Calendar

The fouowinn candidates 
have authorized this 
iHAispaper and paid coni­
mi rual rati '  tn be listed as 
( arnlnlate'

( iiuiits ( iinimissioner, 
l*re< iiii l Two
O.K. (JackI RIackwell, lii- 
1 unitient
Count) Judge;
Scott Bailey, Incumbent

District Clerk 
Marcici G Justice 
Mary Jane Rowch, Incum­
bent

Congress, ITth District 
Charles Stenholm, Incum­
bent

HOME REPAIR 
SERVICE 

Carpentry, plumbing, 
ceramic tile, dry w all- j 
ing, carpets, linoleum, 
pain ting, roo fin g . 
Reasonable. 442-3737.
P-17

THRIFT SHOP 
Hhy run to garage sales 
when we have over 500 
family items from 10 to 
25 cents off each item. 
C lothes, fu rn itu re, 
dishes and household 
items. 510 East 7th, 
Cisco, p-16

NOTICE

7M3T

C IS C O -E A S T LA N D -
RANGER

S U B S C R IP T IO N S  
RATFIS: City and in 
county $13.00. Out of 
( ounty and out of state 
$16 00. $1.25 by the 
month.

THE CISCO PRESS
pMblirathMi Nu. iL S P S  llJT M i 

442-22M TOtAveO . C ite« . T e » »
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TEX AS PRESS ASSOCIATION

NOTICE: Unless you hove estobished credit 
with the C isco  Press aR classified ads must 
be payed in odvonce.

SAW SHARPENING 
SERVICE

Scissors, hand saws, tin 
snips, circular saws, 
chain saws, lawn mower 
blades. R.B. Boyd, 1602 
Ave. H, Cisco, p-tfe

STOP!'.
OPPORTTNITY

KNtKTvS
Earn $10,000, $15,000. 

$20,000 or more a year you're 
very first year. We will send 
you to school for two weeks, 
tram you in the field for sell­
ing and servicing establish­
ed accounts. Must be 21 or 
over, have a car, be ben­
dable, ambitious, and sports 
m inded. E xce llen t
hospitalization and profit 
sharing plan.

Call for an appointment. 
Joe Jacobsen 

Thursday & Friday 
1-800442-3347 

9 a m. to 5 p.m.
Equal Opportunity Co. p-14

FOR RENT: 2 bdnn., 1 
bath house in Cisco with car­
port. No pets. Call 
915-6254051. p-15

FOR RENT: 3 bedrooms. 2 
bath, den in Cisco. $250 per 
month. Call 4424777. p-17

HOLLIS WILLIAMS 
CONSTRUCTION 

Residential and com­
mercial. Remodeling, 
addons, new homes, 
custom cabinets, con­
crete, electrical work, 
etc. 442-1933, Cisco. 
p-lOtfc

Allen's Heating 
Air Conditioning 
Sales & Service 

854-1795, Baird p-tfe

In ONE FAMILY Out 
OF 5. MOTHER Gets a 
JOB To Help PAY For a 
CHILD'S UNIA'ERSITY 
EDUCATION. LIFE IN-1 
SLKANCE Can Help] 
AVOID THIS!

Freeman Draper Custom 
Drapes for one window or for 
the whole house. For more 
information call 725-6684. 
444TP

The Osco Press

IMPORTANT 
Check your ad the 

First Day it appears In 
event of errors, please 
call immediately to 
have it corrected. No 
claims will be allowed 
for more than one incor­
rect insertion.

The publishers liabili­
ty shall be limited to on­
ly the amount of space 
con.sumed by these er­
rors.

REST OF THE GOSPEL
This area of the nation shall soon be blessed with one 

of our Father's temples; a House of God. In these 
temples are kept some of the most sacred keys to our 
Father's Kingdom. In these temples there exists a little 
bit of heaven itself. A latter-day Temple is one of the 
most sacred places on earth. So sacred that only 
members of Jesus’ church are allowed to enter into 
(kid's Holy House. It is knowrn that vnhen the Nauvoo 
Temple w;as dedicated In 1846 that the Holy Spirti 
descended upon it with such power and glory that peo­
ple came from miles around, for they thought it to be 
on fire. With the dedication of a Temple comes some of 
(knl’s greatest blessing. Let us tell you about our 
Father's eternal plan. The Rest of the Gospel, P.O. Box 
763, Cisco, Texas 76437. p-17

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank all 

of our good friends and 
neighbors for their help and 
other consideratioas after 
our house burned to the 
ground January 26 in 
Eastland.

We would especially like to 
thank Mr. and Mrs. Fullen of 
Fallen Motors of Eastland, 
also we would like to thank 
R ichard  and Barbara 
Rossander, Mr. and Mrs. 
Campbell. Mr. and Mrs. 
Heidenheimer of Cisco and 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Taylor.

Thanks to all of those who 
brought clothing, and toys 
and all the other many gifts.

Sincerely,
Dan and Helen 

Wilks and family
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CISCO T.V.
IXIZER SERVICE &  

Tanking, brush pushing 
and all types of dirt 
work. $35 per hour. Call 
Bob Hallmark. 442-2127

442-2632

p-tfr
♦ 308 Wst 3rd.
♦
4- Talavition ond Antwnna Sarvic*.
♦
♦ Naw Zaoith T.V.s
t a * » » » » » » » 4 M S » 4 4  4^»4^»»4MM4444^»4S»-V4^4^»

c NOTICE

FKKSH doughnuts, cin­
namon ro lls , tw ists 
Delivered to Cisco home or 
office Tuesdays through 
Saturday. Deliveries bet­
ween 11 00 a m. and 12 00 
a 111. Call 629-2002 a day 
ahead Tfn

NOTICE
A 10% discount can ^
yours on shoe and boot p 
repairs. Ask us how at i  
the O.K. Shoe Shop, 503 K 
Avenue D. p-17 k
.WWVWWWa.'VWklCWW.SfWSkV

I
»{

FIAKIR COVERING 
1NSTAL1J4T10N 

Carpets, vinyl, tile 
ceram ic  (ba ths ) 
Reasonable. 442-3737
P-17

THE C LE A N  
SWEEP

Chimney Sweeping

Wood heater 
service and 
Installation 
817-442-4568.

p-5tfc

 ̂ 442-4212 ^
ELECTRIC 

wii^ino k  nErnm ^ehvice 

cLCCTnicnL m u i ^  nrrunner. m m  é  r i \ m

n o w  8th. St. Cisco, TX.

STEVE COZART 
CONSTRUCTION 

Remodeling 
Add-ons 

New Homes 
Cabinet 

Concrete 
Electrical, etc. 
Free estimates 

Phone 442-1709 p41tfc

HOUSE LEVELUNt. 
Interior and exterior, 
pa in tin g. F ree
e s t i m a t e s  
1-915-893-5803. Clyde
p-28

Cantra«:* eympiag

Will iami  P v m p m q  S e rv ic e
B L (Rocky) Williom*

P O BÜ» Aji
laSiNO star  J l*A i  ’R4M

3«M

TIUPMONl 
(•171 64}  4« « }

N O T IC E : For home
delivery of the Abilene 
Reporter News' If you live 
north of 8th Street or west of 
Avenue N ca ll Laura 
Hamilton. 442-4007 p-tfc

*  Anything done around g the house. Painting. S carpentry work, con-jj Crete work, small plum- j bing. etc. Call 442-1446.;
S p-33tfc

HOUSE LEVELLING 
916-893-5803 

Clyde P-M6

Mr. Farmer or Rancher 
Want to Lenae your land 
for oil and gas? Write 
Tbomton Investments, 
P.O. Box US. Croat 
Plains, T e u a  7844S. 
p-8Kfc_______________

• r v f l
\F.TFRANS 

Move inio a NEW 
home for Jnst 
SI total cost!

No Closlag costs.
No Down ptyments.

SI does if til!

OPEN SATURDAT

Ahilcnt MoMIe Homes 
4618 Nonh First 

672-646(

 ̂ Econom y C a b in e ts  & C o u n ter Tops ]
Phone 442-4191

Comer of Ave A & East 14th, Cisco.
Formicha tops custom mode cabinets 
bathroom vonitys general home repair 

and remodeling

FOR RENT: Furnished 
one bedroom apart­
ments. All bills paid, 
plus T.V. cable. Rent by 
week. 106 Elast 14th, 
Cisco, p-20

HOUSES FOR RENT: 3 
bedroom s, 2 bath, 
carpeted, fenced. Small 
2 b^rooms, 1 bath. In­
quire at 1205 West 8th, 
Cisco, p-15

M O B ILE  HOME 
SPACE FOR LEASE: 
One acre tract. 442-3330. 
p-4tfc

M IN I WAREHOUSE 
STORAGE as low as $20 
month. Call 442-3340, 
Cisco. p-57tfc

FOR SALE: Nearly new 
1980 DH-5 case trencher with 
6-way backfill blade and 
front-mounted backhoe. On­
ly 100 operating hours. Good 
buy Call Mac Sayles, 
Tuscola, Texas, 915-554-7884 
after 5 p.m. or weekends.
p-16

PITT GRILL in CLsr 
a ciKik and wailres.sr'

WANTED: landowners
that are offering season and 
or day lease privileges for 
hunting gam e. Cisco 
(Chamber of Commerce, P.O. 
Box 991, Cisco, Texas 76437, 
817-442-2537. p-84tfc

WANTED: RN 's and
LVN's. Flexible hours and 
competitive salary For 
more information contact 
Jan Beck, D irector of 
Nurses, Callahan County 
G enera l H ospital
915-854-1287. p-14

WANT TO BUY: Between 
Cisco and Baird, 160 to 320 
acres grass land. Needs to be 
fenced . Contact W.C. 
Schneider, 915-677-2054 or 
692-3246. p-17

PA R IT IM E  CASHIER tor 3 
to 11 Friday and Saturday 
nights. Taylor Center 805 W 
Main. Tnf
uiiiiM iniiiiiiiiiiiiiim iiiiiM iiL

I  M )R  S A LE : Hogs S 
i  Registered Duroc. GiltS 
E and boar. Call H.T. Sut- s 
= ton after 5 p.m. a lS  
i  (¿47-1026. i
niMiiiHiiimiiiiiiimiimmmr.

H E LP  W AN TEL 
Mature cashier. Apply 
in person at Taylor 
Center, 100 A\e. P 
Cisco. p-45tfc

WANT TO 
LEASE

PEANXT LAND 
442-3667. p-22

FOR S A L E : Chevy
Chevette, 1978. $300 equity 
and assume bank payments. 
Call 442-4777. p-15

FX)R SALE: FerUUxed 
coastal hay. $2.50 a bale. 
Some large rolls $25.13 miles 
south of Cisco, then two 
miles west. 915-366-(X)55. p-17

FOR SALE: Baby crib, 
dressing table, Hitasche 
amplifier, 25 inch black and 
white te lev is ion . Call 
442-2747 after 5 p.m. p-14

FOR SALE: 1978 (Tievy 
Chevette. Assume payments 
of $156 per month with small 
equity. Call 442-4777 or 
629-2002. p-lOltfc

FOR SALE: 1971 P&H 
Welder and various 
tools. Call 442-1729 after 
4:30 p.m . .o r on I 
weekends, p-17 J

FOR SALE: Bermuda 
grass hay. Conrad 
Schaefer, 643-2528, Ris­
ing Star, p-21

FOR SALE 
Peanut Hay 

442-3667.

FOR SALE: 1980 Suzuki 
DS 185 dirt bike. Bought 
brand new in 1980 for 
$1,089.00. Looks like 
new. Very low hrs. Sale 
price 500.00. Call 
442-3736 after S p.m. p-22

d r iv e  5 5
t h e l b x ^ W a y

Nice three bedroom frame, good location in the coun­
try, with small acreage.

Neat frame in finest location, paved street, handy to 
school and worth more. $15000.00

Five room, attractive, location good close to school 
interior need redecorating but priced to make It wor­
thwhile. $14,500.00

Solid, attractive five room dwelling, comer lot and 
good location.

Brick dwelling with small acreage, like country liv­
ing only in town.

A very desirable roomy frame dwelling, comer lot, 
paved street and ready to move in.

Small but neat and solid, four room frame Just right 
for a couple, priced right.

Good two story, paved street, comer lot priced 
$20,000.00 less than actual value, need to sell for cash.

One of the better two story bricks, paved street ex­
cellent location and well equipped.

A very attractive Spanish type stucco, garage apart­
ment. corner lot and paved street.

Beautiful frame dwelling with large storage building 
and plenty of ground.

Notice, some of the above listings can be owner 
'inanced at a lesser rate of interest.

We have other property to pick from. Business is 
good and we need more listings. We do not just list pro­
perty, we sell it.

tf07 Ave. Da, Qsco
Garl D. Gorr 

Real Estate Brokerage
Three salesmen to ossist in a i phases 

of the work. 442-3642 or, night 442-1642

FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Small fast food 
business netting $18,000 
yearly. $10,000 plus small 
balance on equipment. Call 
442-4777. p-17

HOME FOR SALE: 3 
bedrooms, 2 baths, large den 
on two lots. $18,000 firm. 
Owner will finance at 12%. 
Call 442-4777. p-15

REAL ESTATE

FOR SALE BY 0WNE:R: 
Executive home, brick, 3 
bedroom, 3 bath, approx. 
2400 sq. ft. including 600 ft. 
office area. Central heat and 
air, pool, fireplace, built in 
kitchen, double garage on 72 
wooded acres. 12 miles South 
of Cisco on Hwy. 206. Some 
minerals $150,000. Phone 
817-725-6300, 817-629-8768., 
TNF

TRADE brick duplex, 
furnished garage apart­
ment, close in for pro­
perty in Dalla.s area. 
Call 442-1788. p-20

----T/Z

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2 
bedroom s, 1 bath and 
garage. Terms available 
with approved credit. Call 
442-1566, day or 442-1295 
night, p-17

»¡'OR SALEBYO W NEiR  
3 BR, 1 Bath. Living 

J. room. Dining room. 
^Kitchen comer lot 

large oak trees - quite 
neighborhood 
fireplace double car 
carport loragc/shed 

711 E. 21st, Cisco. 
Call 442-2211(ask for 
Ron P a tton ) or 
442-4377 after 5:00 PM.I

FOR SALE: Large 2 
bedroom, 1 bath house, 
paneled and carpeted. 
Includes business office 
and two large lots. Call 
owner 442-1289. p-17

FOR S ALE  B Y l 
OWNER: 3 bdrm., 2 
bath, 10 yrs. old, gold 
medillion, fireplace, 4.5 
acres, brick, 2 car | 
garage, water well 
fenced back yard, cen 
tra i a/h. $57,000 
442-1910. p-20

Use The Classifieds

f o r  SALE: 3 bedroom 
home with life time vinyl 
siding, all paneled, carpet 
and drapes, dishwasher and 
garbage disposal, 24 lot.s 
with good water well, 2 
storage buildings, 2 air- 
conditioners, and pool table 
included. 508 East 8th, Cross 
Plains, 72&«648 or 725-7311. 
p^2tfc

FDR SALE: Commer­
cial building across 
street from Bank. About 
40’ X 100’ sales floor, two 
rest rooms, four office 
rooms, vau lt, attic 
storage space. 713 Ave. 
D, Lone Star Gas office 
building. Call 44M588 or 
see Wayne West. p-69tfc

SWIMMING POOLS
BY Roger Steele -

Custom Design
i t  Gunite, Fiberglass, Vinyl Liner 

i f  Pools, Spas, Hot Tubs, Therapy, 
Sounas i f  Pool Mlaintenonce & Repair
For Fr#« Coll Collwct (817)968 6394 otiwr 6 p m

PLUMBING
SjMciol Rotti For Those On fhttd Incomet 
CarpentTY t  Electrical AI Work Guoronteed

647-1432
TF

* i(4 t4 y  iy rM 4 /» f* n n e  t i( c *  A i€ 4 i€ tn

i

806 West 13lh. 2 bfdnxim.s, 2 lot.s. 80‘Kj financing 
po.'iSiblc, $22,000

605 West 11th. 2 bedruoni home with fenced yard 
Priced to leave you with fixing up money. $13,000

801 West 7tli. Lovely 2 bcdroo.ii home, guest house, 2 
carport, beautiful yard. Kedui nl $49,750.

708 Ave. I. 2 story with columns, 12 big rooms, pretty 
kitchen. $70,000

30 acres south 1-20 cast city limits. $56,000.

1405 Sirmns. 3 bedrooms, 14 Ijath. $61,000. Can 
assume w ith equity purchase.

AIJWOST SOLD OUT 
WE NEED USTINGS 
LET US SELL YOURS TOO

Anita Webb, Associate, 442-3S46 

Ray Moody, Broker, 725-7279

/ u . u i ^  . ' / - / /  a n < /  A  i  ,  i f r . H . - . f u .

• jt fy  n *- ,

i ,7



Homes, sues, construction. Bcmodeling
Complete Remodeling 

Concrete-Electrical 
Roofing

Patios-Driveways 
Room Additions 
Siding-Windows 

Plumbing 
Chain Link Fence 

No job too large for A-1 
Sales

215 S. Walnut 
629-2102 Anytime

\ Choice sites for
•  Mobile homes
•  Homes
Located south part 

I Pogue Ind. Park.
A-1 Sales 

215 S. Walnut 
629-2102 Anytime

Î  EASTLAND COUNTY BUILDERS *
îfro fM *lonal. In »»modnling t Nnw Con.trwtiton tn.utotlnn *  
J  -goofin»-- ♦
»  All typos of othor work ^
i  Coll 817/442-2745-Evoninps 442-1049 W

Metal Bu ild ing*~V
rtfllAll Welded Construction 

Clear Span to 60’ Wide 
Any Length

Built to suit your needs 
A-1 Sales

L 215 S. Walnut 
629-2102 Anytime

■ p *  '
* NOTICE: Doke Johnson 

Contractor Remodeling, 
Concrete, E lectrical, 
Plum bing, Fencing, 
Boat Dock, House 
Leveling. Call 647-3682 

, or 647-3679.

SHOP EASTLAND COUNTY

Front End 
Algnmoiit 

Jim Cdd w il Motors
314 W. Main Eastland

y * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * W * * * *
sidentlal and commer- 

icial. Remodeling, ad-ons,| 
¡concrete work, new homes, j 
¡electrical work, etc. Mickeyj 
Iwilliams65^2235. TCH
E**W*W***W***tHEWWW**s

If  . 'J'X/'Ji
New Home %

^  Just Completed % \
3 Bedroom 2 Full Baths Tile Entry, Full 

Carpet Self Clean Over, Dishwasher, 
Disposal

160 Acres or 80 Acres 
oil fenced, tank, good soil, 

owner finonce at 10% interest, 
Down negotiable. Ronnie Hay 

Hurst & Assoc. 1-594-1676

LOAN PRODUCTION A RIAL ESTATE

COMPUTI 104N SfRVICi 
(117) »1« SSI* OMit. 

I'H7) t n  17*4

CAROL UNRil. ■'•k*'
Ml Wrsl Mam Stmt 
Ê astland. T»»»» 7644*

A V A IlA B ll IM M lD IATtir 
DOWNTOWN 

OFFICE or RETAIL SPACE 
FOR RENT

WM remodel to suit tenant 
St0V0 Haines

Steve's Printing
FOR SALE: 6 rm. house and 
8 lots on comer in Cross 
Plains, bam and garage. 
Reduced to 86,500.

10 A. 2'ii mi. West of 
Weatherford, close to 1-20, 
High Meadows addition, ex­
cellent terms, financing 
available. $30,000.

We have acreage large or 
small as well as dealing in oil 
and gas prdouction, leases, 
and oil field equipment. 
Call: Dora Smith, Choate 
Realty, Cross Plains. Ph. 
817-725-6489 after 4 p.m. and 
weekends. 4-2tc

FOR SALE: Total Electric 
rock home and 4.99 acres on 
Hwy. 6 south, approximately 
3 miles from downtown 
Eastland. Central heat and 
air, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths, 
large living room, den and 
kitchen. 2 fir e  places, 
covered patio, double car­
port, 3 outbuildings, pasture 
completely fenced on rural 
water system. Excellent 
commercial location. Shown 
by appointment only. Call 
629-2966 a fte r  6 p.m. 
weekdays. TNF

r e alto r  ;

h o m es-r a n g e r
Very attractive two story home with four bedrooms, two 
baths. This is an older home that has been well kept with 
a large master bedroom, seperatc dining room, living 
room, seperate garage with two storage rooms This 
house is on 1'4 lots, very nice neighborhood.

Rock three bedrooms, two full baths, large den with 
wood burning fireplace, game room, large patio enclos­

ed. This place is on six lots.

Brick three bedrooms, two baths, den. living room, din­
ing room combination. Fenced back yard with 
workshop, double attached garage.

Three bedrooms, utility room, nice l“ tchen, Franklin 
v S  stove in living room. This place has three storage 
buildings. This house was completely redone two years 

ago. $22.500.

Older home on about ‘ i  block with three bedrooms, one 
bath This house needs to be re-done, priced right to sell

$15,000.
This house could be made into a nice large home. Three 

l»th . ! • «  H .. e l m .  m

dining room. $16,500.

evaooraUve cooling, comer lot and W. F e n c e ^ c x  
yarTrange and cooktop, washer and dryer connection. 

Thia’houae wtU FhA finance.

KINCAID REAL ESTATE
I {

8 1 7 / 6 2 9 - 1 7 8 1 100 S. Seaman St. 

EASTLAND,TX 76448

RESIDENTIAL HOMES & ACREAGE
COME LOOK AT THIS ONE! This house has 2 
bdrms., 1 bath, big fenced yard with pretty trees 
and covered back porch. Will make someone a very 
comfortable home. Owner will finance. Priced 
lower for cash. $35,000.

WANT TO LIVE IN THE COUNTRY? Try this 4 
bedroom, 24 bath house on 2 acres of land. Has 
vaulted ceiling, ceiling fans, and very nice redwood 
deck. I/Ots of room. Call us to look. You’ll like it. 
Priced at $72,000.

NOT GETTING OLDER-GETTING BETTER! This 
older frame home has been recently improved with 
paint, panelling and carpet. Has 2 or 3 bedrooms, 1 
bath. Roomy house on big pretty lot. Lots of trees in 
nice quiet neighborhood. $24,500.

COMMERCIAL

DOUBLE WIDE MOBILE HOME Only three mon­
ths old. Is fully furnished and has a fireplace, loo. 
Has 3 bedrooms - 2 baths. Washer and dryer includ­
ed. $32,000.

IN RANGER-2 bedroom, 1 bath house with chain 
link fence. Would make a good first home. Has 
assumable 10% loan. Affordable and nice. $18,000.

COMMERCIAL BRICK 2 STORY BUILDING 24
blocks from the courthouse square. Sturdy con­
struction but needs remodeling. First floor has 2 
large rooms with approx. 2,500 sq. ft. Second floor 
would make nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath apartment or of­
fice with approx. 1,000 sq. ft. ALSO: 2 bedroom. 1 
bath frame house. New paint and carpet inside. All 
on 4 adjoining lots for $40.000.00. Possible owner 
finance.

COZY & CUTE-2 bdrm, new paint and carpet. Small 
yard, carport on paved street. Nice for single or 
starter home. $25,000.

a f f o r d a b l e  LIVINCr^Slart with this small home 
2 or 3 bdrms., 1 bath. $12,500. Owner will finance.

LARGE OLDER frame house on over sized lot. 7 
rooms and full attic. Lots of space inside. Needs 
remodeling. Would like to trade for airplane or 
other. $30,000. Great commercial location!!! Loca­
tion on Hwy. 80 in Ranger.

LARGE OLDER frame house on over sized lot. 7 
rooms and full attic. Lots of space inside. Needs 
remodeling. Would like to trade for airplane or 
other. $30,000.

THRIVING BUSINESS-Local business that grossed 
(740,000 in 1979. Excellent cash flow and terrific 
location. Terms negotiable.

SEVERAL MOTELS-Listed in various parts of the 
state. All excellent investments. Call for location 
and details.

LAKE PROPERH
ULKE LOTS-We also have many lots available 
some with excellent water frontage. The fishing is 
good and the price is right. LL-01.

BUILDING LOCATED IN CISCO- Good 
Downtown Location for onY tYpe business. 
5,000 sq. feet. Coll for details *60,000

REAL CUTE-2 room, split level cabin with 
fireplace. Lots of storage and 2 out buildings and 
boat dock. Ixicated on nice waterfront deeded lot on 
I.ake Leon. IjoUi and lots of potential. $25,000.00.

Kincaid Real Estate
Robert M. Kincaid, Broker

Eddie Kincaid (817)647-1902 Milta Kincaid (817)629-8757

JAMES W. RATlirr
REALTOR-BROKER

647-1260
Three bedrooms, two full baths, central heat and air, 
utility room, nice large kitchen, dishwasher, wall oven 
cook top Approx, five acres of land with barns go with

this place.

1980 Mobil home on eight lots. Three bedrooms, two ful 
baths, central heat and air. There is a large 24x30 s^el 
building with concrete floor that goes with this pro^rty. 
Also a 14x20 storage building. $65.000. Some owner finan­

cing available. •

7,000 sq. ft. Delta Steel building in Ranger. This building 
has large truck scale that goes with it.

Two lots on Hw7. 80 next to Food-Fair. This is a good 
commercial location.

Brick three bedrooms, two full baths, den with wood bur­
ning fireplace, kitchen with double wall oven, earning 
cook-top. dining room, living room combination, central 
heat and air. utility room with washer dryer connec­
tions. Fenced back yard with covered patio, two s t o ^  
buildings. This is located in a nice neighborhood. $75,000.

‘Twenty four loU in l4ickland Addition, good commercial 

property.

LAKE PROPERTY
Thirty two acres on U ko U on  with a three bedroom, 
two bath house. Several barns and sheds, young or­
chard. good garden spot, ten acres of Klein grass.

$60,000.

Tile block house on deeded lot, one large bedroom with 
large open area living room with sleeping facilities. Tius 
place has boat dock. All furniture and appliances go with 
place. $30,000.

We lo lk lt your liftings on any type of Real Estate

ACREAGE
5-7 ACRE HOMF^ITES-Uts of trees, nice view, ci­
ty water. Close to town. I.<ike Leon, country club. 
Flexible financing. Sell or trade. Buy one or buy all! 
Call for more details.

78.4 ACRES-South of Cisco on Hwy. 2526. One tank, 
15 acres coasUl, 47 acres love grass. New corrals, 
new fences. One-fourth of the minerals go. $96,000.

42.53 ACRES-Oak trees, pasture land. New tank- 
really pretty land. Come and look at it. Owner will 
finance. $685/acre.

42.8 ACRES-Coastal and love grasses, 3 tanks, 
water well, corrals, roping pen. bam. very pretty 
homesite. Northeast of Eastland. $1000/acre.

50 ACRES-All secluded. 35 acres timber, river bot­
tom, 2 Unks, well. 15 acres culUvation with small 1 
bedroom house S. of Cisco. Some owner finance. 

$l,000/acre.

93.34 ACRES in Okra area. Has good stock tank, 57 
acres cultivation. 18 acres of pretty timber. Also a 
33 acre peanut allotment. Owner will finance with 
29% down or will Texas VET/Also will divide. Has 
minerals that will go. Great buy at $540/acrc.

»7 ACRES-aboul 4  native paslure, some improve­
ment Older frame house and dairy bam. Owner 
finance. $567.00/acrc.

420 ACRES-Peanul fami. Fully cultivated and ir­
rigated, 4  minerals. Beautiful 4 bdrm, 3 bath home 
with fireplace. Excellent investment. Call for more 

details. •

We want to 
SELL your listing

Dabhv nràiid (817)647-1401

r ealto r

647-1667
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY FARMS AND RANCHES

Irrigated farm in Yoakum County. 835 acres, all but 80 
acres in cultivation, five water wells, one older house. 
Crops look real good this year, still in the field. Some 
owner financing available.

161 acres west of Ranger, cross fenced. 40 acres <rf 
coastal, klein and love grass. Set of good pens, four 

tanks.

90 acres South East of Ranger, 20 acres of coasUl, 18 
acres Blue stem, 16 acres In culUvatton. Four tanks, one 
water well, bams, pens. You can purchase cattle, equip­
ment and all with the place.

W n ttfiM « 
M t f l l '



I
♦  

I *  
♦

ÎÎ
4-
4
4
4
4
4
4
4

Mne Star Titl» 
A Abstract Go.

J og I .  loooM, ■gr.
101 W. MMin 

l i S t l A B é ,  Ttxu 70448 
(8171 8 t8 .f8 8 S

4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 
4 

T -C 4
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 4 * * # # « ^ * «

--------Am  SOON-------------
JAY-WAY JANITORIAL SUPPLY

Comm«rdol-lndu*trial RMid*ntiol

Orders Con Now Be Mode

By Calling 629-2190
FREE DELIVERY

"Rent-Don't Buy"
DON'S RENTAL

1610 W Main Eastland
629 1632

T U

& e  M.H. Perry for 
D IS A B IL IT Y  IN ­

SURANCE 
629-1566 or 629-1095 

104 N I^amar-Eastland

. T-C

HEAR > BUT 
DON’T UNDERSTAND 
Quality hearing aids 
starting at $285.

Clinton Hearing 
Aid Center 

114 W. 8Ui Cisco 
442-2168 or 442-3752. p-13

J A A Bonioin Box

W. Main 701
Now A Utod 
Morchonditf 

629-1133

BIBLES AND ALMANACS: 
Start the year right. Your 
local newspaper has a new 
stock of Texas Alamancas 
and an assortment of quality 
Bibles including the Living 
Bible, Large Print Scoffields 
and Riversides, etc. Check 
your local newspaper office.

KING INSURANCE AGENCY
REAL ESTATE
M rs. Opal C. King-BrokerCISCO 

106 W. 6«ti 
442-2552 Res. 647-1510

RANGER
207 Moin 
647-1171

RANGER

REAL NICE two-bedroom, one bath dwellmg, 
carpet, nice kitchen cabinets, car-port with storage 
room, small builduig. fenced back yard, comer lot. 
Owner will carry, with Vj down. Reduced for quick 
sale

Home with six comfortable rooms, one bath. Good 
location, paneling, two refrigerated air unit, 
assumable financing and owner will carry some equi-

ty.

f CARPET = F 5 î v
insulofion. '

I
( d

Inttoll now or used 
carpet.

Carpet Repair^ 
734-2918 11 

.Carbon, Te*. r  ' ^

g W H B R î
^  and Reoair 
SBuy, soil or trod* 
fsOI W. Com marc

NEED A HOME
DRiviAiimr

SAVE A LOT ON YOUR MOBIL 
HOME FHA VA FINANCING

WE ALSO HAVE 
MOBIL HOME 
INSURANCE

— PHONE:

EASTUND 653-2432
D iR EQ  FAMILY OUTLET

Interstote 20 Old«n South Side of Highwoy
PRODUCE

GOOD COMMERCIAL location: two bedroom house, 
store building, trailer park with six hook-ups. loU of 
beautiful trees, on 23 lots, on Hwy. 80, inside city limts.

Very affordable m 
Located on fenced I 
trade.

• •• (eith one bedroom.SOLO erested in sale or

NICE 5 room dwelling, 2 large bedrooias. large kit­
chen, built-uis. new plumbing, attached garage, in­
terior ref inishod. Owner would consider partial finan­
cing. $27.500 00.

Lively two story cottage, 4 bedroom and spaciiws 
kitchen dining area. Has been re-wired, extensively 
remodeled, with fresh decorating Ideas. Ceiling fans, 
unique wall treatments, beautiful carpets. Must see to 
appreciate.

We Need and Appreciate
Your Listings

Conventionol, VA, and FHA 
Finondng Availoble

Ardfth ColdweR 
442-2134

Portrida C. Nowak
672-5711
672-5521

< 5 0 0 0  0 0 ° * ^ ^

aoooeoooooooooooooooooaooeoeooooooooooooooooooooooooô

lee Russell 
647-1383

Don Adah 
629-2848

Equal Housing 
Opportun itlM

* « A ^ o « a
Helen Bradford, Broker 
Kea Ponock, Assodore

Main Of^e-205 Eost Mobi-Ronger. Texas 347-3230 
Broach Offiee-116 NorHi Seamon-Eostlond, Texos 629-8641

SAVE TAX DOLLARS-INVEST NOW and let rent in­
come make your payments on these 4 houses on 
150x136 foot lot in Eastland. Approx. 1868 square feet 
fully carpeted, 3 bedroom, 2 bath, fireplace, cedar 
cabinets, central heating and air conditioning. Would 
make lovely home. Other houses are now rented. 
Nice location.

BUSINESS BUILDING located on .614 Acres on 
Highway 80 West in Ranger. Approximately 1350 
square feet newly remodeled would serve for four of­
fices. Price reduced for quick sale. Call today. 
lJUlGE BRICK BUILDING downtown Ranger. Ex­
cellent buy for Mechanic. Living quarters, lots of 
ropm for Garage. Pricod right to ■ell.-SSB.OOO.OO

BEAUTIFUL 3 Br., 2 bath, C H/A, fireplace, 
calhedral ceiling one of the best built homes in 
hanger - Pier St Beam with slab in Game Room with 
liar. Cedar inside and out. Approx. 2900 sq. ft. 
.Assumable loan - 6 lots.
161 ACRES 10 miles northwest of Ranger will sell all 
or divide. 40 acres of coastal. 3 tanks, some trees. 
Good loading corrals, chute, hunting and fishing. 
C ross fenced, 5 pastures, road frontage on 2 sides, 
assumable loans with |20,000 down. $550.00 per acre. 
Beautiful home site among oak trees.
6*2 ACRES includes pecan orchard & fruit trees. Ap­
proximately 1900 square feet in house. Double car 
port L  patio-Beautiful place. Make offer.

22 ACRES Close in-I-20 Highway frontage-in Ranger. 
Ijirge House, lots etc. Call for more details.
120 ACRES Vk minerals on this. Cleared, excellent 
grass, city water available, some of the best black 
land in Stephens County. Will sell all or divide. 
Available financing. N e ^  tax deduction? Consider 
this! $550.00 A.
TWO-STORY 5 Br. 2 bath, fireplace, hardwood floors, 
some carpet. Priced to sell! $31,500.00 
APPROX. 13 lots - good location 2 blks. off Hwy. 80 
$4000.00
IDEAL Hwy 80 E. Business property! 2 A. with house 
and shop building. Lots of highway frontage. Great 
location - call today!
800 A. Coleman Co., Ranch land, V, minerals, 10 wells 
and still drilling. Cross fenced, good tanks, excellent 
hunting $100,000.00 down and owner carry $320,000 at 
present FLB int. Rate.
320 A. Coleman Co. Black Land Farm - all cultivation. 
H minerals $220,500. - 30% bal. down - Owner finance. 
Located on Hwy.
320 A. Coleman Co. 320 A. Black Land Cultivation Vk 
minerals, beautiful home, on Hwy. $340,000 - 30% 
down and Bal. Owner financed.

MOBILE home to be moved - 14x8 Wayside. 3 Br., 2 
b., 1 walk-in shower 4T C H/A, wet bar and stools, 
DW, stove. Ref. WI/M-W.6tD. Carpeted, drapes, 
shades, $21,000.00.

J"

RESIDENTIAL
SPACIOUS HOME ON 2 I>OTS-4 bedrooms. I ' l  baths, ful­
ly carpeted, custom kitchen with built-ins, energy saving 
storm windows. Covered patio faces large, fenced back 
yard Near schools See this one soon!

RENTAL PROPERTY-3 bedroom 1 bath home on large 
lot $12.500 00

lA K E  IJION Deeded lot Approx 200 ft road frontage 
Approx. 65 ft. waterfront. Willow Beach subdivision, old 
Staff Road.

RANGER. OU 
priced. SOLD lots. Needs repair. Bargain

5 ACRE^ of oak trees is the setting for this large brick 
home with 3 bedroom, 2'^ baths, separate dining room 
and living room. Lived in only 2 years. Good water well, 2 
septic tanks, total electric, l/xrated near Gorman.

53 ACRES conven* 
tered trees. Watt 
for Texas Vet. wi

SO lp
nd. All cleared with scat- 
County Road. Will divide

(papers.

60 ACRES So. of Cisco, 1 mile off Hwy. 206. Approx. 30 
acres coastal, 15 acres love grass, some timber. One good 
stock tank, shallow hand-dug well.

■ ■ ■ •> ' ’  J  •

79 ACRES sand 
fences, at Older

astal, mostly cleared, good

NEW HOME C0MP1J:TED on 2*4 ac with own water 
well. 1300 .sq. ft. Brick home, total electric

CORNER l/)T-3 bd. 1 bath home with attached garage in 
Ranger.

3.965 ACRES in City Limits with mobile home hookup, city 
water. Cleared, fenced, .some large pecan trees.

60 ACRES, 26 acres peanut allotment, 1 water well, sandy 
loam, south of Cisco. Approx. 1 mile off pavement.

OFFICE HIGHWAY 80 E 629-1725
JUST LISTED; Colonial brick on choice \UHKied lot in 
Crestwood Just finished complete renii'dellmg - new 
carpet, new kitchen, new drapes, fenced ba- k yard, dou­
ble car garage. Immediately possession - Equity Buy.

FHA-VA CONVENTIONAL FINANCING
BARBARA LOVE, BROKER

fOUAl NCUSNW 
oreos TuaiTiit

LOOKING FOR A COUNTRY SITE FOR YOUR NEW 
HOME? 12*2 acres on blacktop near l..ake I^eon has staff 
water meter in. access to lake thru nearby permanent 
ea.sement.

LAKE LEON-perfect hideaway, 2 bedroom, I bath frame 
home on hill overlooking lake, has beautiufl view, boat 
dock, good water, on large deeded lot.

BRICK BUIDUNG with 20 x 25 ft. office on several lots in 
Gorman. Excellent for garage or small factory.

GORMAN-brick hom** 
bedrooms, 2 ba 
in like new coi 
FHA loan.

; noiiwsovp )loc‘k from scliwil Four 
r lot. Only 2 years old and 

T̂ uity and assume low interest

LIQUOR STORE in Ranger. High volume, excellent 
return.

BUILD your dream hou.se on one of these 2 to 3 acre 
tracts. I„ocated on Hwy. 6, 5 miles S. of Eastland. City 
water available.

COMFORTABLE AND AFFORDABBlJ!. This large 2 
bedroom (or could be 3i, 1 bath frame home sits on 3 lots 
in quiet, secluded area of E^tland. Home has had recent 
remodelling, new carpet, has carport and one-car garage. 
Beautiful lot with large trees, garden spot, 2 animal sheds 
Equity and aasume.

LAKE LEON is the ideal place for year-round living or 
summer fun' This attractive, well-built home has been 
remodelled and is ready for immediate occupancy . Large 
tree-shaded, fenced lot, staff water and many other ex- 
t r a s .

COMMERCIAL PROPERH

COMMERCIAL BUILDING WITH LOTS OF POTEN­
TIAL: On 7.68 acres located on 1-20 access in Ranger. 3 
truck stalls, one office and parts storage area, approx, one 
year old. Built-in air compressor and overhead hoist. Now 
used as diesel mechanic shop. Excellent location for ex­
posure to Interstate 20.

51 ACRES with beautiufl 3 bedroom, 2 bath 5 yr. old brick 
home. Horse pens, 3 stock tanks 25 acres in coastal, good 
fences. Ixicated 4 miles NE of (torman.

6*̂ 4'ACRES with new large 2600 sq. ft., 3 bedroom, 2 full 
baths, family room, separate utility. Only 3 months old. 
Plenty of trees. Just outside the city limits of Gorman.

THRIVING BUSINESS-Ideal family operation Retail 
sales and service in Ranger. Don’t delay.

OLDEN: Neat, small frame home on 15 lots, large trees, 
one bedroom or could be one and small child's room, 1 
bath, living room/dlningAitchen combination, nice 
cabinets, carpeted, utility room, 2 storage buildings. 
Reasonably priced. Call today.

RENTAL INVESTN’ ENT; 3 homes on one large lot. 100 
percent occupancy, nu "'um upkeep. Chain link fence, 3 
car metal garage -in go< xtion convenient to schools. 
If you’re in the rental mark. ’t miss this opportunity.

ACREAGE
161 ACREX of excellent gras.'land complete with steel 
pens and loading cute. 40 acres of coastal, 20 acres seeded 
in improved grasses. Good outside fences, cross fenced 
Front County road on two sides. 4 tanks, one hand dug 
well. Located NE of Morton Valley in Stephens County. 
Financing available. Will divide.

20 ACRES approximately 3 miles west of Gorman. Co-Op 
water can be arranged. Some minerals.

160 ACRE^ South of Ranger off E'M 571 in Rustic area. 
Unimproved, 2 tanks. Excellent hunting area for deer, 
turkey and quail. Ideal for group Investment.

WE WANT YC 1 BUSINESS-YOU ARE OUR BUSINESS
PiGGTi SWAFFORD 647-1050 BARBARA LOVI 647-1397

2 ACRES AT OLDEN: 7/10 mUe N. of North 1-20 access 
road. Good sandy loam soil, pear thicket, figs. Has 3 room 
and “ path" house in bad repair, at no extra charge. Elep- 
tricity and water available at property line, $4,500.00.

it *-r 4



In Brief
Visitin« Mrs. Ruth Boyd 

Sunday for Valentine’s Da> 
and her birthday were her 
children, grandchildren and 
great-grandchildren. They 
were Norm a and W.L. 
Glasgow of Buffalo Gap, lin- 
da Pearson of Abilene, Bob­
by, Joyce and Sherrie Boyd 
of Moran; Gaston, Wanda 
and l.eo Boyd, Donald and 
Terry Don Boyd of Cisco, 
Danny, Shelia, Jamie and 
Robin Boyd, all of Cisco, 
Tommy and Dorothy Boyd of 
Cisco, Glenn and Tanuny 
Boyd of Moran, Kathy and 
Shelley Agnew of Cisco, Bar­
bara, Charley and Tonia 
Adams of Eastland, Buster, 
Gloria and Angie Boyd of 
Cisco, Ttanay, Michell and 
l>eAnn Rabb of Cisco and 
Mrs. Turnbull of Cisco.

Arrest Mode In Robbery
Ranger Police O fficer 

John Mackey gave the 
following account; At ap­
proximately 7:45 p.m. Fri­
day, a black male about 6’2” , 
entered the front door of 
Allsup’s Convenience Store 
on Highway 80 west and 
Blackwell Road, and with 
some type of pistol held up 
the clerk, Frank Jones. Sub­
ject left on foot to Sinclair 
Street behind the store.

Information given to the 
Ranger Police and Sheriff’s 
Department led to Ranger 
Junior College. The Dean of 
the College and the Coaches 
were very helpful and were 
able to discover the name of 
the suspect, Frank Miller 
Walzer.

Walzer, from Kansas City,

Mo., was a student at RJC 
trying out for back-up 
quarterback. He was ap­
prehended at approximately 
10:30 Friday evening. A 
notable amount of money 
was recovered from his 
room.

Walzer was taken before 
Justice of the Peace I.W. 
Uasery who set bond at 
$50,000. Upon hearing this 
the suspect’s feet collapsed 
and he fainted.

Members of the Ranger 
Police Department and the 
Sheriff’s Department made 
a trip to Dallas unnecessari­
ly early Saturday morning to

bring a black male student 
back to Eastland County for 
questioning in regards to the 
robbery at Allsup’s. After 
talking to the student and 
other students at the college, 
he was released. Walzer still 
remains in custoday in the

county jail.

Thursday,
Fobruary, 18, 198? Oil News

A ll TRADES ENTERPRISES
Laurunt (Lonnie) C. Pingreo

Nimrod Highway 1 ^  
y  ̂  Cisco, Tx 76437 ^

I  Phone 817/442-4856 1
Y  817/442-1158

X  Honest-Sober-Dependoble
"1» yoor" Texas Commercial License 1 

operotor sick. I
on vocation Truck Troctor Trotlor Bockho« m 
or |u*t crowlor troclor A hoovy oquipmont M i 
aono? oporotor X  §

IM O V IN G  s œ N !
Service on all makes 
Qualified Technitians

Jako OÜ ot lexas, a
Alii

W SgU P H IL C Q  «
Adding RC^ Soon'

Sight N Sound TV
(Formerly Rockwell Lumber 107 E. 5th.) 
Will be moving Next Door to Toler's

Automotive

«

«

No Job 
Too 

SrTioll

f Carpentry Work
Froming, roofing (now A ropoirs) odd on$ 
intorior A oxtorior Building A repairs, mosonry 

^^^^lurribing A oloctricol repairs

Yard Work
Tree Service, removal A 

thinning, light A locol houling 
(such at baled hoy. debris, pipe machinery.

" s e r v i c e  M e a s u r e d  n o t  

b u  q o L d  ;  b u t  b u  t h e  

^  q o L d e n  r u l e ? "

e le c tr ic
p h o n e  442-4421
ow ners c o r i  b e q l e q  

x i M  C h e s h i r e

s p e c i o L  s e r v i c e  c a l l  

r o t e  o f  $ 1 5  t o  o L L  

c u s t o M e r s i n  f e b r u o r g

Energy Saving tips on 
Electric Heating.

C heck your ther­
mostat setting.
Recommended tem­
perature setting for 
winter heating is 
6 8 °. Rem em ber, 
the lower you set 
the thermostat in 
the winter the lower 
your energy cost.

Have your heating system checked regularly!
Proper servicing is good preventive 
maintenance.

Keep filters clean. Check the filter every 30 days on forced-air 
systems If filter is permanent, clean it by manufacturer's direc­
tions, if it’s disposable, replace when dirty.

Have your home properly insu­
lated! Adequate home insula­
tion keeps the warmth in, cuts 
energy use . . can pay for itself 
by lowering heating (and cool­
ing) costs

Use the warmth of the sunshine!
On sunny days open the drapes. 
The sun shining through the glass 
will supply additional heat at no 
cost.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANYWIV
A MwwMw •«( TNi i  Vlf̂ i

Remember, Reddy Supplies the Energy, 
only you can use it wisely!

A N O
' ^ h i P S H t ó O S è

Thi quHtion M wtwrt wi * slop'’ Mwiy 
people hM no Idea Lite cm be iMd ei a 
flurry ol actMly — IMtmg tram ptraon. to 
mmg to dream, and back agam Or a can 
iusl same nto a monotonous routine Either 
way meanmglaesness has taken hold

Lack ol meaning m Me has been called 
furious actMly around an «nply career 
That's what a whiripoai ■ ActMOas. 
msetmgs. schadules parties appomiments 
— but no dirsction Tht siwrlKig pace can 
gsito you -  especially it there s a 
txiNowness msata

Jasus talked a kS about meaning m lite 
But he nol only talked about it He \
Kl M

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH
17th at Ave E 

CISCO, TEXAS 76437

Sunday Schoal........  10:00 A.M
Marning Sarvica........  11 ;00 A.M
Evoning Sarvica........  7:00 P.M.
Wodnoeday Sarvica........  8:00 P.M.

F A I T H  C E N T E R  ^
Philippians 2:16

Sunday Morning—10:00 
Sunday Eveninar— 7:00 

"»"hursday Ev*»ning—7:00
2 4  H o u r  P r a y e r  L in e  442-1828 442449S 442-2355

Ana#

JESUS IS LORD
Temporarily Meeting At Cisco Revival Center 

Corner of East 7th & Ave. A Cisco p.8s-tfc

Denton firm , filed  
aplications to drill 
three proposed 
4,000-foot wildcats in 
the area nine miles 
southwest oi Cisco in 
Eastland County.

No.6 V.L. Frazier is, 
located on a 107-acre; 
lease. ;

It spots 1,450 feet; 
from the north and 440 
feet from the east lines i 
of Section 111, Block 3, 
H&TC Survey, A-183. !

No.l bacon is located; 
on an 83-acre lease,’ 
spotting 330 feet from 
the north and 1,674 feet 
from the west lines of 
Section 93, same block : 
and survey.

No.2 Bacon spots 
2,412 feet from the 
north and 1,151 feet 
from the west lines of 
Section 93.

ybur ' 
mariMtpiaBe

WANT ADS
Q M W i a M t n i B l r

OiMlty - Snopiliott 
ComarM A 5«pples| 

FImt-AI th t t  
And off Conrto 

Rno Photognphy 

Is Onr Bnsinott.

COTTON'S 
STUDIO

PMCfS EFFECTIVE FEB. IB-20.1982 
«NILE SimiESLAST

COOKED FOOD SPECIAL
Chopped B-B-Q Sondwidi

99*
SUISHIBE RRISPY

CRACKERS U l
10$ 89

 ̂iVs^id9i\,\Vs Qot to be goo(/,

Noinz Ketchup 

32 oz. Jor $1 OFF
06

1857 1982
Del Monte
Com, Green Boons,
Sweet Peof 4 cons »1

. BORDEN'S HI-PRO

m ilk BAI
CTf

$*|09
MORTON FIMILY PAR RiaZED

1107 
PR(DORUTS $ 1 1 9

BORDEN'S OCT PRO

POPSICLES 89
BORDEN'S ICT. PRO.

Fudqesicles 89

A l l s u p S
C O N V EN IEN C E S T O R E S

THERE'S OHE HERR YOU'



Rural Water Supply Corp. 
School Set For March 1
The Farmers Home Ao- 

ministration has announced 
sponsorship of a Rural 
Water Supply Corporation 
Operators School, to be held 
in the facilities of the Taylor 
Electric Cooperative at 1610 
North F irst in Merkel, 
Texas

The School will be con­

ducted for five nights, giving 
20 hours of credit to those 
students who successfully 
complete the school.

The first session is planned 
for 6:00 p.m., Monday, 
March 1, 1962, in the Taylor 
Electric Conference Room 
Classes will be held each

CHRISTMAS 
in February

wrapping paper - a l boxed cords 
nome togs - omoments

2 for 1
Buy one at regular price &  
get one of equal value FREE

Every Occassign
311 W. Main

night from 6:00 to 10:00 p.m., 
March 1 through 5, 1982.

Instructor for the couse 
will be Jim Cates of the 
Texas A&M U niversity 
Engineering Extension Ser­
vice.

Topics to be covered in­
clude bacteriological quality 
of w a ter, ch em ica l 
ch a ra c te r is tic s , w ater 
d is in fec tion , w ater 
hydraulics, pumps and 
m otors and routine 
laboratory tests.

It is anticipated that a 
number of area residents in­
volved in City or Rural 
Water Systems will take ad­
vantage of the opportunity to 
improve their skills by par­
ticipating m the course

Civic League 
Reminded To 
Bring Bulbs

Civic l>eague Members: 
Don’t forget to bring your 
bulbs by the clubhouse Fri­
day, Feb 19 from 10-12 a.m. 
l.et's spruce up the park!

Medicare Patients 
To Pay More For

Part A This Year
Medicare patients, you’ll 

pay more for your Part A 
"deductible" this year -  
that’s the part you pay for 
yourself (or which you may 
have supplem ental 
isnurance fo r ),  reports 
Judith L. Warren, a family 
life education specialist- 
aging.

As of Jan. 1,1982, patients 
are responsible for the first 
$260 of each new 90-day 
benefit period. In 1980, the 
Part A deductible was $180. 
In 1961, it was $204

A lso , during 1982, 
Medicare patients in the 
hospital from 61-90 days will 
be responsible for paying $75 
a day, rather than the $51 
they had to pay last year.

Warren is on the home 
economics staff of the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
v ice , The Texas A&M 
University System.

Thursday, February 18, 1902

OIney Sovings Announces Restructure
e n B H >

SiNocn Salxs and ScnvtCK 
Only AuTMomieo Dcaucr In Ea»tuand. County

C IT Y  S E W IN G  C E N T E R  
HENRY WELLMAKER OWNER 

RCFAin A ll  m a k e s  and  Modcls  
s e w in g  Mach ines

Coll 629-1481 for pickup 8 dolivory-No Chorgo!

3 0 2  E M A I N  
E A S T L A N D  T E X A S  7 6 4 4 8

Vac u u m  Clcanem  Repair  
A ll  Makes  and  Models

Olney Savings Associa­
tion, a $300 million savings 
and loan serving northwest 
Texas, announced today a 
com prehensive m anage­
ment reorganization.

NBC
NEWS/MUSIC

FM97
RADIO W 24 HOURS

G O O D W YEA R
SERVICE ̂ STORES

PresUetn’s Week • Special Sale Prices Thmughoat The Store.

OÆÂRAMœ
Power Streak 78

A78 13 
Blackwall 
SI 42 FET 

No Trade Needed

Discontinued Design 
Clearance
First Come First Served 
No Rainchecks 
All S izes On Sale

‘ > 4
O  .

Site Bleckeiall 
Sete Price

WMiewaH 
Sate Plica

H S I Z 3 I
JKjjTrJJB

f - t A78-13 $26 95 $28 35 $1 42
D78-14 $33 30 $34 95 $1 70
E 78-1 4 $34 15 $35 85 $1 80
F78 14 $3590 ' $37 70 $2 12
G78-14 $37 10 $38 95 S2 26
G78-15 $38 20 $40 15 S2 35
H78-14 $38 20 $40 75J $2 49

it,?' H78-15 $39 95 $4195^ $2 54
L78-15 - $47 20 ' 52 79 ^

EVERYDAY LO W  SERVICE PRICES
12-MONTH
TUNE-UP

iKtronlc Ignillon Sytitmt 4odi 
jnai oans and se'»ires ema ii ireefle' 
lost US ca - '■'» in-ooiis an*
JW irucks
Idctronic linltion • Cheer chargmq 
atlmg and engine systems • Install 
>w rotor ne* soair giugs • Set iimmg 
'ecommenrted sgecs • LuBncaif and 

iiust chore • Adiust caibuietor 
landard l|nltl«d. Add $8 00 tor 
qinied oomts condense' and additional 
Ml

12 MONTH TUNE UP 
SERVICE AGREEMENT

xxtyear «nil tune your engine electron 
ally and give you thiee tiee engin« 
lalyses any lime vrithm one yea; 'I any 
these check ugs mdicaie the need 

r adiustmenia oi pan repiKemenis 
at were part ot the onqinai tune up 
xidyear «nil tn it lr«d Asr mi' store 
anager tor details

WHEEL
ALIGNMENT
•If. »iCww«

Puces Stan 
at St9tor 
our leguiai 

iiont end alignment se'.'ce 
Pans and add tionai sei.ice 
enia o needed
PttlM« TItt IMt tMlt MFC
• Inspect all lour tires • 
Correct air pressii'e • Set 
front wheel caste' camper 
toe to proper alignment
• Inspect steering and sus­pension systems
Most U S cars Imports «ritP adiustaP'e supention 
Includes front wheel drive 
Cheveltes light trucks and cart requiring Mac- Pherson Strut correction 
extra

41 iGtmtm  N f4001/44 n i l s
roe fa rm i WMffi «4 wmti omnsuso

LUBE & OIL 
CHANGE

includes up to 5 gts maiO' orand motor Oil and com- 
piete chasis lupncatio'- 
Oil tiiter extra <t needeo 
Mo»f U S cars rnany m. 
ports and light trucks Please call for an appoint­
ment
Includes our 9-Pt 
Maintenance Check

SAVEI
BATTERY 

CLEARANCE 
 ̂ SALE 

»

' Oicontmued mprehah. 
Jise includes Goodyear 
Powerhouse Power- gard Powerga'd 40 am 
WL'aiher Deluxe GT and 
commercial batter es 

' All lines not avaiiapie at 
all locations Can tor 
vour siie and price 
tvo Paih CriecKS • Ouar- 
tilies iim ted

SAVE!
CUSTOM
WHEELS!

3 DAYS ONLY.

S U P E R IO R
C A LIFO R N IA

W IR E

4 f o r l 9 9
u i6 «l’espoie 

36 1460

Tfipie piated chrpme stee' European-inso red design 
The Classic look tor any car 
comes complete with na'd- 
.'.are Lug huts extra 
• 4 lor 1219 Its X 6 Wire 

spoke- 361560 
Expert wheel service alto ivaiiaoie -  Mounting ancing Bai.

YOUR CHOIC
In „nae'-dash AM FM 
rad c 8 tape oiaye' — 
6-t'iC" j' cassene 
KID 55' 58-

^69
Sa.̂  5‘ h? -■ :i. do

, 9 -rardeex
F --Mr 1 ;:.ana of, ,c tiBif Swax/'S -
«:9 00
I'M  - '0'4 1Q15

Ivaristo Jimtnaz, Mgr.

Your Local
PtMMM 629-2662 Mo«, tbni M . 7:30 a.m. to 6:(

eor Service Store
p.Ni.7 Sot. 7:30 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.

315 East Main

Eastland

“ Over the past two years 
we have been working on a 
new structure in anticipation 
of the heavy growth we ex­
perienced in 1981," says 
Alan D. Myers, Jr., presi­
dent and chief executive of­
ficer.

The new system consists of 
an executive committee, a 
second-tier senior manage­
ment team , d iv is ion  
managers, headquarters 
operations and branch 
management.

The executive committee 
will consist of Al Myers, 
president and chief ex­
ecutive officer; Wade Fikes, 
ex ecu tive  v ic -
-president/chief operating 
officer; David Ickert, ex­
ecu tive  v ic -
-presiden t/ finance and 
operations; and Jeff McClat- 
chy, ex ecu tive  v lce - 
president/marketing and 
development.

The senior management 
team will be made up oi the 
executive committee, divi­
sion managers and Bodie 
Schm idt, sen ior v lc e - 
president^avings; Wayne 
D avis, sen ior v ic - 
-presidenL/data processing; 
Nona Lowe, senior vice- 
president/human resources; 
Ted Beck, v ic- 
-president/installment and 
commercial loans • banking

services coordinator; Bren­
da Boydston, administrative 
assistant to the president 
and chief executive officer 
and Charles M itch e ll, 
president/Olney Mortgage 
Resources, a wholly owned 
subsidiary of Olney Savings.

Division managers will 
consist of; George Medlen, 
sen ior v ice -p res id en t 
m anaging branches in 
Olney, Seymour, Jacksboro, 
Graham and Archer City; 
Howard Meyers, senior vice- 
p res iden t, m anaging 
Bridgeport, Nocona and 
Bowie; Jerry Richardson, 
senior vice-president in 
charge of Ranger, Eastland 
and Brownwood; Bill Baker, 
vice-president overseeing 
Azle, Weatherford and Fort 
Worth; Ray B. Dickey, Jr., 
executive vice-president 
controlling Electra, Wichita 
Falls and Vernon; and Jerry 
Watson, executive vice- 
president over Decatur and 
Boyd.

Branch managers will be: 
Dan Winingham, Olney; 
R .J. Jeanes, Seym our; 
Carole F itz g e ra ld , 
Jacksboro; Howard Meyers, 
Bridgeport; James Oldham, 
N ocona; B ill Baker, 
Weatherford and Azle; Jerry 
Richardson, Ranger; Craig 
Lund, Eastland; Ray B. 
Dickey, Jr., Electra; David
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Art Classes
Beginning Feb. 18 

Quick Lmdscopes wHh
Billie Planche

for boginnors or odvonced

Morren's Gift Shop
3 1 0 1 3  W . M o k ik i la s t ln ic l

TC

629-2092 S

Rater, Archer City; Gordon 
Grubbs, Graham; Sallie 
Ford, Wichita Falls; Ben 
Wagner, Vernon; Jerry 
Richardson, Brownwood; 
Tim Pigg, Bowie; and Jerry 
Watson, Decatur and Boyd.

The headquarters office 
will be managed by I,aVelle 
D av is , v ic -
-president/mortgage loan 
services; Tom Enloe, vice- 
president/credit services; 
Danny Goldsm ith, vice- 
president/controller; Steve 
Slater, vice-president/loan 
officer; Margaret Whitaker, 
co rp o ra te  s e c re ta ry ; 
Delores Hinson, assistant 
vice-president/checking ac­
count services; l.,aVerne 
Wood, assistan t v ice - 
p r e s i d e n t / a s s i s t a n t  
secretary/installment len­
ding services; Wilma York, 
assistan t v ie -
-president/credit services; 
Eva Joy Strealy, assistant 
s e c r e t a r y / in s u r a n c e ;  
Dorothy Cuba, assistant 
secretary/accounting ser­
vices; Lorita Dieterichs, 
assistan t v ic -
-president/mortgage loan 
services; and Bobbie Bailey, 
assistant secretary/taxes.

M yers  com m ented , 
"Many new avenues of op­
portunity are opening up for 
us. Challenges abound. And 
with this distinguished group 
we will meet these new 
challenges."

“ The purpose of this new 
structure is to enable us to 
meet the demands of a grow- 
ing o rga n iza t io n ,”  he 
replied.

All Repavs
Jim Gildwell

Motors
31 4 W. Main Eastland

NBC
NEWS/MUSIC

FM 97
RADIOS 24 HOURS

SAVE!
AUTOMOTIV

STEREO
BY KRACO

EASTLAND COUNTY
BUSINESS SERVICES

Your new one-stop location for
 ̂BOOKKEEPING 
 ̂TAX SERVICE 
 ̂PUBLIC ACCOUNTING

JEAN COLEMAN
20 years experience

r

HOLLIS PERKINS
28 years experience

READY TO GO TO WORK 
FOR YOU RIGHT NOW.

EASTLAND COUNTY BUSINESS 
SERVICES

PHONE 817-629-1061
East Main St.-Eostland.

T ie



Computers Etc. No. 4 M .H.M .R. Work

Grand Opening Feb. 20
Computing and Informa­

tion Sciences, a Cisco based 
computer consulting f|rm 
has acquired a franchise 
agreement from Computers 
Etc. of Dallas to operate a 
retail computer sales and 
service store here in Cisco. 
The store is located at 805 
Avenue D and is named 
Computers Etc. No. 4.

Stephen F. Wheeler, who is 
head of the Data Processing 
department and is instructor 
of Data Processing, for the 
past five years, at Cisco 
Junior College, will run the 
retail sales and service 
operation. Mr. Wheeler is 
also the president of the con­
sulting firm. Computing and 
Information Sciences.

The store is the first of its 
kind in this area, and will 
service a one hundred mile 
radius. The store will sell 
sophisticated business com­
puter systems for smalt, 
medium, and large size 
businesses. Their main pro­
duct line features the power­
ful SD Systems Computers 
m anufactured by SD 
Systems of Dallas - a wholly 
owned subsidary of the 
Michigan General Corpora­
tion. These computers are 
unsurpassed by their power, 
versatility, and reliability. 
They are state-of-the-art, 
high technology machines.

According to Mr. Wheeler, 
no other computer available 
from any other outlet within 
a one hundred mile radius 
can even approach the 
capab ilities  of the SD 
systems Computers. These 
machines will also be very 
cost competitive and expan­
dable should the purchasers 
future com puting r e ­
quirements increase. The 
systems will range in size 
from the WS-800 single user 
computer system and word 
processor, to the giant 96 
megabyte SD Systems 700 
multi user time sharing com­
puter system. l.,easing is 
available on these systems.

Mr. Wheeler emphasizes 
that in all too many cases, 
people have paid a fortune 
for a small computer to help 
them with their bookkeeping 
chores, which they purchas­
ed at a little computer store 
from a salesperson who may 
know som eth ing about 
stereos but cannot tell a 
computer from a calculator; 
and therefore the buyer has 
not been able to receive 
training or service for the 
machine after it was install­
ed in their place of business. 
Mr. Wheeler further states 
that his company will pro­
vide on site, same day ser­
vice, and loaner machines if 
necessary, should any pro­

blem arise with the equip­
ment; and further, that he 
will provide comlete training 
on the use of the computer 
equipment. He will help the 
purchaser select the right 
computer system and pro­
grams to meet the individual 
needs.

He will provide turnkey 
computer system packages 
for one price consisting of 
hardware, software, service, 
training, and installation of 
the purchaser’ s site of 
business. In addition to 
state-of-the-art business 
systems. Computer Etc. will 
also carry a full line of Atari 
personal computers and 
associated games and soft­
ware. The store will have its 
grand opening at 10;00 a m. 
Saturday morning, Feb. 
20th. Demonstrations will be 
provided free of charge; cof­
fee and donuts will be served 
all day. Technical engineers 
and representatives from 
the Dallas home office will 
be in the store all day Satur­
day to answer questions and 
perform demonstrations on 
the equipment. The store 
will remain open until 8:00 
p.m. Saturday.

Shop Needs $5,500
The Eastland County 

MHMR work shop is in high 
gear for the combination 
Rummage and Bake Sale, 
Saturday 20 February and 
Monday 22 February. These 
sales are the first of our 1982 
P’ und Raisers. The continua­
tion of the MHMR Work Shop 
Program is directly depen­
dent on the success of our 
fund raising activities. For 
the balance of this fiscal 
year ending 31 August we 
need approximately $5,500.

Our sales this month 
feature a lot of merchandize 
not shown before. Addi­
tionally we will have lots of 
baked goods and crafts. We 
need help financially as well 
as donors of Baked goods 
and merchandize for resale.
An added attraction is that 
we will serve free coffee and 
cookies both days. So come 
on out even if you do not 
want to buy.

Remember if you have 
merchandize to donate or 
will bake for us we will pick­
up. For this service please 
call Idella Taylor 629-2341 or 
Don Jones 647-3477. The 
work shop is located at 306 
W Plummer, Eastland. The 
Sales will be from 9 a.m. to 6 
p.m. both days.

P lea se  support your 
MHMR work shop by 
donating to the Memorial 
Fund.

Bullock Reports 
Series Tox And

i RANGER TIMES EASTLAND TELEGRAM 
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$41,506.67. The percent 
change to date is 14.89%.

Eastland’s net payment 
this period is $36,493.39. The 
1982 payments to date are 
$46,417.43. The percent 
change to date is 47.38%.

The net payment this 
period fo r Gorm an is 
$4,861.45. The 1982 payments 
to date are $5,393.83. The 
percent change to date is 
-16.78%.

Ranger’s net payment for 
this period is $16,801.30. The 
1982 payments to date is 
$23,476.43. The percent 
change to date is 16.41%.

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock reported Tuesday 
that the more than one and a 
quarter billion dollars worth 
of mixed drinks Texans 
bought during 1981 netted 
$125 million in tax revenue 
for state and local govern­
ments last year.

Bullock made the observa­
tion in returning more than 
$10 million in local shares 
rebated of the 10 percent 
gross receipts tax on mixed 
drinks to 383 Texas cities and 
209 counties for the fourth 
quarter of 1981.

Texas cities and counties 
receive a 15 percent rebate 
of the tax charged on mixed 
drinks sold within their 
boundaries.

The state will pocket more 
than $24.3 milion from mixed 
drink taxes drom the Oc­
tober, N ovem ber and 
December period.

During 1981, the state’s 
share of mixed drink taxes 
totaled $88.7 million. City- 
County rebates totaled $36.3 
million.

The tax, authorized by the 
ame law that legalized mix- 
J drink sales, is collected 

by the Alcoholic Beverage 
Commission and rebates are 
sent quarterly to cities and 
counties by the Comptroller.

Eastland County’s 15% tax 
remittance is $1,679.78. The 
15% tax remittance for 
Eastland is $153.%. For 
Ranger the remittance is 
$308.98.

.Make the.
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Air Condition Worit
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Eagle Scouts To Be Recognized
Mixed Drink Tax

state Comptroller Bob 
Bullock Thursday returned 
$106.4 million in local sales 
tax payments to 954 cities 
who levy the one-percent 
local tax.

“ This is the biggest single 
payment since city sales tax 
rebates began in 1%8,”  
Bullock said.

The $106.4 million pay­
ment represents a 16 percent 
jump over last February’s 
checks, which in turn had 
grown 16 percent over the 
previous Feb ru ary . 
Payments so far in 1982 are 
running 13.2 percent above 
last y e a r ’ s January- 
February total.

“ This increase is higher 
than inflation and population 
growth put to g e th e r ,”  
Bullock said, “ and at least 
part of this rise has to come 
from our work making sure 
these cities get every penny 
of sales tax that’s coming to 
them.”

The biggest check-$22.4 
million—went to Houston, up 
23 percen t o ve r  last 
February’s check.

Dallas received  $11.1 
million, compared to $10.5 
million for the same period 
last year.

The city and MTA sales 
taxes are collected along 
with the state sales tax by 
merchants and businesses 
and rebated monthly to the 
cities in which they are col­
lected by the Comptroller.

The net payment this 
period for Cisco is $31,091.99. 
The 1982 payments to date is

At Boy Scout Dinner Saturday
Each Eagle Scout who has 

earned Scouting’s highest 
award during this past year 
will be introduced by his host 
at the Boy Scout council’s 
recognition dinner to be held 
this com ing Saturday, 
February 20, at 7:00 p.m. in 
the Adams Street Con,’".’ini- 
ty Center, Brownwood 

E ag le  Scouts to be 
recognized are: David Isom 
and Jet Hays of First United 
.Methodist Church Troop 14,

Brownwood; Joe Denton, 
Elbert Trowbridge, Jody 
H air and C harlie  
Trowbridge of Kiwanls Qub 
Troop 22, Brownwood; Dan 
Stephens and Robert Pettit- 
john of Rotary Club Post 30, 
Dublin; Glen Deitker of 
First Presbyterian Church 
Troop 101, Cisco, Carl Wor­
thington of Kiwanis Club 
Troop 18, Stephenville; J.W. 
Hall of Volunteer F ire 
D epartm ent T roop  90,

d h iv e  5 5
► --------------------------------------------

thoTbxasW ay
Texas

D ep artm en t of Public  S a fe ty

Kem pner; and M ichael 
Bradle of Lions Club Troop 
34, Lampasas.

Dr. Ed Gamer of Coman­
che, president of Comanche 
Trail Council, Boy Scouts of 
America, will preside at the 
dinner which wiil include the 
presentation of a Silver 
Beaver award for outstan­
ding leadership and com­
munity service by an adult 
Scout leader.

Unit and den leaders, na­
tional jam boree troop 
leaders and community sus­
taining membership enroll­
ment chairman will, also, be 
recognized for service to 
youth through Scouting.

E.L. “ Buddy”  l.angley, 
p residen t of G en era l 
Telephone Co. o f the 
Southwest, is featured 
speaker for the dinner

HEIDENHEIMER'S

Final Clearance
Two Racks of Ladies Long Sleeve Tops

' ' 4 #  / f -  \  O ' V «

A  / " ^ N e c k

Velourt 
Flot Kmtt 
or Wovon

9.0^
A f t

Men'f 
Long Sleeve 

Sport Shirts

Values to M6** 
To

Close Out

$500

New Wrangler Misses and Junior
Sports Weor Arriving Doily

HEIDENHEIMER'S
Your Family Western Store in Gsco

b r a ttò  ® pQning
5<rturday February 20, From 10:00 a.m . to 8:00 p.m.

COMPUTERS ETC. 
of Dallas No. 4

-Retail Business and Home 
computer snles-

Open House all day Saturday
-Free coffee and donuts- 

-Free computer demonstrations-
Feoturing turn-key computer systems

for Business:
SD systems computers 
ond word processors

for Home: 
Atori computers

80S Avenue D 
CISCO

Phone 442-4232
Store Hours:

Monday 5:00 PM to 9:00 PMj fhursdoy 9:0(1 AM to 6:00 PM 
luesdav 9:00AM to 6:00 PV I Friday ?-O0 PM to 9:00 PM 

Wednesdov bv appointment 9.00 AM to 8:00 PM
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C o u n t y  C l e r k ’s  R e p o r t

In itru m en li Flled-Co.
Clerk’s Office

Ames, Inc. To Cordova 
Resources, Inc. R/W

Aries Petroleum, Inc. To 
Abilene Natl Bank Deed of 
trust

Air Drlg. Asso. Inc. To 
Tra-C Oil & Gas Abstract of 
Justice

Glinda L. Barr & Husband 
To Cordova Resources 
OGML

Lynn Bint Petr Co. To 
J.E. Gardney Part. Asi^n 
OGL

H O. Bateman To Great 
West Energy Inc. OGML

William F. Bowles & Othes 
To Sun Oil Co. Corr. Asgn 
ORR

Sarah Ellen Cockrum To 
Cordova Resources OGML 

James Millard Cockrum 
To Cordova Resources 
OGML

Alm a Berd ie Gould 
Copeland To Cordova 
Resources R/W 

Chase-Mann Petro, Inc. To 
Louis Page Asgn OGL 

Chase-Mann Petr, Inc. To 
Martin W. McAllister Asgn 
OGL

Chase-Mann Petro, Inc To 
Dr Tom Howorlh Asgn OGL 

Chase-Mann Petro, Inc. To

' J j  ' J i i ï  y iE

(4
T . .  L H

Office 629-2 Ì 51 ‘ ‘
210 Exchange Bldg.
Eastland Home 629-2093P

James E. Sharpe Asgn OGL 
Chase-Mann Petro, Inc. 

John Roy Sharpe Asgn OGL 
Chase-Mann Petro, Inc. To 

Richard A. Cameron Asgn 
OGL

Chase-Mann Petro, Inc. To 
Dr. Geo. W. Cameron Asgn 
OGL

Richard A. Cameron To 
Chase-Mann Petro. Inc. 
Asgn OGL

Edith A. Jones Chasteen 
To Sun Explor. L  Prod. Co. 
OGML

Edna Mae Jones Chasteen 
To Sun Explor. L  Prod. Co. 
OGML

Olen Edgar Chasteen To 
Sun Explor St Prod Co. 
OG.ML

Susan Margaret Christian 
To Sun Explor St Prod. Co. 
OG.ML

Howard A. Collins To Sun 
Explor St Prod. Co. OGML 

Katherine Church Car- 
mody by Tr. To Sun Explor. 
St Prod. Co. OGML 

Command Energy Corp. 
To Mc.Millan Industries 
.M.ML A ffd t

T.J. Cross & Wife To BAR 
Petroleum, Inc. Ratif. OGL 

Robert C. Cocran To SO 
Operating Co Asgn OGL 

Iona Cornwell to Great 
West Energy Inc. OGML 

Victor Cornelius St Wife To 
Great West Energy OGML 

Dr. C.C. Deen To Sun Ex­
plor. 4  Prod. Co. OGML 

Eura Davis To Great West 
Energy OGML 

Ina Duncan 4  Others To 
Great West Energy Inc. 
OGML

Jane Day 4  Husband To

Eastland National Bank 
salutes the o il industry.

We <ire e.i^er to help in your growth and welcome 
the opfxirtunity to serve you. You've got a friend — 

in Eastland

EASTLAND NATIONAL BANK
201 East Mam SU eel 0 1 7 , 6 2 9 « » ! Memoef tlJC

T-C lqu.ll ( Ipixirlunitv Empltiver M-F-M

Great West Energy Inc. 
OGML

Dresser Industries, Inc. To 
N icho las P e tro . Inc. 
Abstract of Judgment 

Gustave B. Fred by Tr. To 
Sun Explor. 4 Prod. Co. 
OGML

Ola Frost To Trinity Ex­
ploration Ratif. OGL 

Billy C. Frost 4  Others To 
Great West Energy Inc. OGL 

Sybil Grisham To Cordova 
Resources OGML 

Allie ,M. Griffin 4  others to 
Great West Energy Inc. 
OGML

Joe E. Harrison 4  Wife To 
Carla Petroleum OGL 

Mark Paul Handley To Sun 
Expío. 4  Prod. Co. OGML 

Viola Irene Harbin To 
Dallas Sunbelt Oil 4 Gas 
OGML

O zella  Huddleston 4 
Others To SRG Oil Corp. 
OGML

O.A. Jordan 4  Wife To 
Great West Energy OGL 

Otis Ray Jordan 4 ife To 
Great West Energy, Inc. 
OGL

Jodie R. Jordan To Great 
West Energy, Inc. OGML 

John Bruce Jordan 4 
Others To G reat West 
Energy, Inc. OGML 

Rufus Jordan To Great 
West Energy, Inc. OGML 

W.C. Jordan 4  Wife To 
Great West Energy, Inc. 
OGML

Herman C. Jordan To 
Great West Energy, Inc. 
OGML

Rufus Jordan To Great 
West Energy, Inc. OGML

Herman C. Jordan To 
Great West Energy, Inc. 
OGML

Everett R. Jones, Jr. To 
Sun Explor. 4  Prod. Co. 
OGML

Jordan Fam ily  Trust 
Agree. To Sun Explor. 4  
Prod. Co. OGML 

Joy Fleet Kersh To Cor­
dova Resources Inc. R/W 

Alva Washington Kersh To 
Cordova Resources, Inc.

I
See M.H. Perry for 

GROUP INSURANCE 
629-1566 or 629-1095 

104 N. Lamar-Elastland

SUNBELT WELL SERVICES X  SUNBELT TANK COMPANY

Ò
N o w  Operators con $ o ve  time and money by utilizing this unique n e w  co n ce p l In oilfield service and supplies 

Sunbelt bos combined five area service and supply companies to provide the oilfield with “One Stop" Service 
One call will provide complete service from the onset of drilling to completion and beyond

UNBELT TANKSUNBELT WELL SERVICES
*  ENGINKRING SERVICES
*  DRILLING i  OPERATING SERVICES
*  PUMPER SERVICES

Cloy A Morris. Engineer 
(817)629 1273 

(817)629 2825 (Night)

i f  COMPLniON ft WORKOVER UNITS
Herbert Norman, Pusher 
(817)629-1273 (Doy)
(817) 559-2228 (Night)

^ REVERSE CIRCULATING UNIT
Tim Helms, Operotor 
(817)629 1273 (Doy)
(817)647-5153 (Night)

&

6
6

NIITCHELL'S ELECTRIC SERVICE 
*  MOTORS ft CONTROLS 
i t  NEW CONSTRUCTION 
i t  REWINDING ft REPAIRS
Rodney Mitchell Monoger 
(817) 629-8362 629-1273 (Doy)
(817)629 2876 (Night)

6

COMPANY
i t  OILFIELD STORAGE lANKS 
it  GAS SEPARATOR 
it  WATER KNOCKOUTS OR 

GUNBARRELS 
i f  GAS ft DIESEL TANKS
it FARM STORAGE TANKS

Morion Cowon, Manager 
(817)629-2180 629-1273 (Day)
(817) 559-5351 (Night)
Ron Cornwell, Plant Manager 
(817)629-2180/629-1273 (Doy) 

(817)629-8673 (Night)

DOOL ROUSTABOUT & 
CONSTRUCTION

i t  ROUSTABOUT CREWS 
ir  DOZER ft BACKHOE SERVICES 
i t  WELDING
^  SANDBUSTING ft COATING 
★  POLYTHYLENE PIPE RENTAL 

ft SALES
Jimmy Dool, Manager 
(817)629-1273 (Doy)
(817) 629-8275 (Night)
629 8162 Unit 9881 (mobil;

COOK PUMPING UNITS
S u n b ^ t  carries a full line of Cook Pumping Units, Beam and Counter Balances.
We will soon stock a compleft* line of casing, tubing, rods, wellheads and other

oilfield supplies.
Cloud (Winston) Boles General Soles Monoger 

(817)629 1773 (Day) (817)629-8226 (Night)

ttONE CALL DOES IT ALL t t

R/W
Eslie I. King To Great 

West Energy OGML 
Reba Kelly To Great West 

Energy OGML 
E lizabeth  W illiam s 

l^ngston To Sun Explor. 4 
Prod. Co. OGML 

Dixie Long, Rec'r 29,625 
To Sun Explor. 4  Prod. Co. 
OGML

Don Liles To Great West 
Energy Inc. OGML 

James Liles To Great West 
Energy Inc. OGML 

Kathryn Bell 0. Moss 4 
Husband To Sun Explor. 4 
Prod. Co. OGML

G. G. Murray by Ex’r To 
Great We.st Energy Inc. 
OGML

Dianne Mobley To Rising 
Star O il F ie ld  Supply 
Abstract of Judgment 

Patsy Norris Murray To 
Great West Energy Inc. 
OGML

B.D. McClure To Cordova 
Resources OGML 

F.C. McConnell, Ind. 4 
Others to Sun Explor. 4 
Prod. Co. OGML 

Nationwide Oil 4  Gas To 
H.C. Bailie Asgn ORR 

Clayton Thomas Newman 
To Sun Explor. 4 Prod. Co. 
OGML

Vernon Norris To Great 
West Energy, Inc. Asgn OGL 

Donald James Norris 4 
others to Great West Energy 
Inc. OGML

George E. Norris To Great 
West Energy Inc. OGML 

Pearl Peck To Great West 
Energy Inc. OGML 

Pearl Peck To Great West 
Energy Inc. OGML 

Pioneer Farmers, Corp. 
To Cordova Resources R/W 

Brent Keith Parker 4  Wife 
To Simco Enterprises MML 

Phase IV Petro. Co. To 
Kenneth Loso 4 Others Asgn 
OGL

l.,etha Robertson To Great 
West Energy OGML 

Claudia Ross To Cordova 
Resources OGML 

Mary Jane Rowch, Rec’r 
No. 29,629 To Sun Explor. 4 
Prod. Co. OGML 

Swan E. Richardson Ind. 4 
others to Annie M. Donaway 
Warranty Deed 

Repub lic O il 4 Gas 
Gathering To Snow Well Ser­
vice MMl A ffd t * » « .  • 

Republic Gas Gathering 
Sup. Inc. To N.L. Industries 
MML A ffd t

D.W . Ropo, Co. To 
Petrolero Expl. Inc. Asgn 
OGL

Edith Smith To Great West 
Energy OGML

H. A. Scott, Sr. To Sun Ex­
plor. 4  Prod. Co. OGML

Jerry Sam Scott Ind. 4 
others To Sun Explor. 4 
Prod. Co. OGML 

Alice W. Stevens To Sun 
Explor. 4 Prod. Co. OGML 

Simco Enterprises To 1st 
Natl Bk, Gorman Trans. 
MML

Sundance Energy Corp. To 
W.H. Armstrong Asgn ORR 

Sundanc Energy Corp. To 
Grant Lewis Asgn ORR 

Sundance Energy Corp. To 
W.H. Armstrong Asgn ORR 

Rhonda Tanner 4  Others

N K
NEWS/MUSKFM97
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P.O. Bo k  688 Eottlond Toxoi 76448

Sunbelt Well Service
'>29-1273/629-1493

Sunbelt Tank Company
629-2180/629-1273

SU KnA W fS O* DAUAS SUMMIT 0 4  •  C A S INCOMOMATfO

Oilreloted 
businesses

Wa hove tho bott 
location in Eastland 
for your butinost, in 
POGUE INDUSTRIAL 
PARK located across 
Highwoy 80 from 
Service Pipe & Supply. 
Sell by the lot or 

ocre. A-1 SALES 
215 S. Wolnut 

 ̂ 629-2102
Anytime tc

Eostkmd County 
Newspopers

Salute tbe 

OIL Industry

By Guard. To Cordova 
Resources OGML 

J.T. Taylor To Great West 
Energy OGML 

Neita Ware To Cordova 
Resources Inc. OGML 

Edna Wade To Sun Explor. 
4 Prod. Co. OGML 

R.G. Wheat 4 Wife To Sun 
Explor. 4  Prod. Co. OGML

Tommy Joe Wheeler To 
Trinity Explor. Co. Ratif. 
OGL

Doris Webb To Forum 
Energy Inc. (X iL  

A.T. Wheeler To Trinity 
Explor. Co. Ratif. OGL 

Susan Young To Cordova 
Resources (XiM L

C'Mirl House Nfwt-Ftb. I  
Marrtasr Ureases

Hugh Arthur Ferguson and Louis 
lAT Tellmghiuspr

Wesley Ray Hobbs and AmU Gail 
Stoner

WiUis Gerald Houston and Gladys 
Thalia Mahan

Instnimeats Flled-Co. Clerk’s Office 
AUene West Aiken To The Public 

Unit Agree
W.H. Armstrong To Grant lAwis 

Asgn ORR
Eleanor Apple To Eleanor A. Isiker

M m
James Alexander To West Texas 

Utilities Co. EsmI
Jack Steve Baugh To Jerry D. Max­

well OGL
Kimila Breneman To Leon 0. 

Breneman Warranty Deed 
Lois Burhnan To Billy J Greiactt 4 

Wife Rrl. Deed of Trust 
Lou Buchanan To Billy J. Gressett 

4 Wife Warranty Deed 
Elizabeth Ann Brazell To Anna Mae 

Brazell Power of Atty 
Mitch Bailey To The Public Proof of 

Heirship
Lucille B. Bailey To The Public Pro­

of of Heirship
Minnie B Bailey To The Public Pro­

of of Heirship
Rex Bailey To The Public Proof of 

Heirship
John Dudley Barker To The Public 

Proof of Heirship
Jim m y Bryant 4 Others To 

Eastland Community Day Carr War­
ranty Deed

BiUy R. Baldwin To The Public Cer­
tified Copy Probate 

W L. Brown 4  Wife both Dsc’d To 
The PubUc Proof of Heirship 

Nolan M. BuUer 4  Wife To Strawn 
Security Bk Deed of trust 

Nolan Butler 4 Wife To Aden 
Elmore MML

Mrs Luna Blanc To E. Carter Bill n  
OGL

Frank Barrett To Leo Nell Hall 4 
Others Esmt

Mrs. O.E. Clem To James F. Clem 
Power of Atty.

James Lynn Clark To The Public Af­
fdt

James Lynn Clark To a toen 's  NaU 
Bk Deed of trust

Chalmers Operating Co. Inc. To 
Citizen’s NaU Bk AbUene Deed of 
trust

Lucille Cotten To Charles Hartman 
McCaU Warranty Deed 

CwcU a. Crwnwwio* *  Wife To Fed
lAnd Bk of Tex. Deed of trust 

Elizabeth R. Coles, Dec’d To The 
Public Certified Copy Probate 

Otu Calvin Coles, Dec’d To The 
Public Certified Copy Probate 

G.T. Collins, Dec’d To ’The Public 
Certified Copy Probate 

Bryan R. Collins To The Public Cer­
tified Copy Probate 

V.T. Collins 4  Others To James 
Lynn Clark 4  Wife Warranty Deed 

James Lynn Clark 4  Wife To 
Southern S4L Assn. Deed of trust 

John G. Callaman 4  Others To ’The 
Public Affd

George Crabtree To Jerry D. Pratt 
4  Others Power of Atty.

Paul L. Crabtree To Jerry D. Pratt 
4  Others Power of Atty.

Ruth M. Carter To Opal Carter King 
Warranty Deed

Jetty Anita W. Disheroon To ’The

PubUc AHdt
G.A. Dunn, Jr. To ’The Public Affd.
Odia Devia, Dsc’d To ’Ihe PubUc 

Proof of Heirship
Ruby Pratt Darr To Jerry D. Pratt 4 

Others Power of Atty.
O H. Dick 4  Others To Neal Ed­

wards Warranty Deed 
Grace E. Eakin To Cordova 

Resources Earot
EazUand Ind. School DIst. To a ty  of 

Eastland Lease Agree.
Eastland NaU Bank To JUn R.

Wright 4  Wife Rei. Deed of trust 
Elastland NaU Bank To JUn R.

Wright «  Wife Corr Rei D-T 
EasUand Community Dare Care To 

1st Natl Bk Gorman Deed of bust 
Aden EUnore To Strawn Security Bk 

Trans MML
Grace Eakin To West Tezas UtiUUes 

Esmt
Davide. Fambrough4 WifeToLula 

Mar Basham Warranty Deed 
Winna Lee Fox, Dec’d To The Public 

Proof of Heirship
1st NaU Bk-AbUenr To Archie C. Lit­

tle Rei. Deed of trust 
Fed. Land Bk of Tez To lawson E 

Valler) Sr 4 Wife Rei Deed of trust 
IstStBk-R isingSUrToT.F Reed 4 

Wife Rei. Deed of trust 
Jim Fleming To West Tex UtiliUcs 

Co. Esmt
Gregg E. Goodall To CiUzen’s NaU 

Bk-B'ridgr Deed of trust 
MoUir S. Gholson. Dec’d To The 

PubUc Proof of Heirship 
James H GUinviUe To Univ. of 

Houston Found Warranty Deed 
James H. Glanville To Univ. of 

Houston Found Bill of Sale

fR ^ G rR T lM E^ **ti^ T I.A N D  TEI.KCRAM CISCO PRESS^ 
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EstaUc W. Gray 4  Husband, Dec'd 
To ’The PubUc Proof of Heuehip 

W.C. Gholaon 4  OUiers. Dsc’d To 
The PubUc Proof of Heirship 

PhUUp D. Gierke 4  Wife To Benny 
Slunner MML AfTd 

Luther R. Gohlke, M.D. To ’The 
PubUc Aff d

Eugene Hunter To James F. Clem 
Power of Atty.

Vena M. Hart 4  Others To The 
PubUc DIaclaUner 

John D. Hamilton To Louise 
Hamilton Power of Atty.

Eunice M. HamUton To laulse 
HamUton Power of Atty.

Mittle Joan Pratt Hames To Jerry 
D. Pratt 4  Others Power of Atty.

Ethleen M Johnson To BUly 
Johnson Jr Power of Atty.

Donald Lee Joiner 4  Wife To Tortlno 
Teal 4 Wife Warranty Deed 

Kenneth Jameson Ind. 4  Others To 
Ima Hare 4 Others Agree 

Robert Eugene JusUce 4  Wife To 
Jack Allen 4  Wife Warranty Deed 

Verla Joyce Kemper 4  Others To 
The Public A ffd t

Nona Kennedy To Westview NaU 
Bk-Waco Deed of trust 

Pauline Pratt Kunbrough To Jerry 
D. Pratt 4  Others Power of Atty.

Fred Ughtfoot 4  Wife To Robert 
Mangum 4 Wife Contract 

R.L. 1-ewis 4  (Xhers To Jack Mon­
tgomery 4  Wife Warranty Deed 

Paul laCU ir 4 Others, Dee d To ’The 
Public Proof of Heirship 

Plummer S. l.emley, Dec’d To ’The 
PubUc Agree Not to Probate 

M4H Investments Inc. To Jack L.

SEK V ICEPIPf& SlPPLYCr 
NCW-M & ftftS Wd EqUMKlI- l)$N
SMrtacc M p s«c$ & Service i-r 

M.Nxsft? EasiMM. Texas 7sm  
EasMM

t t  f  f  t  i ‘ à t  t  * f ’(Tt"(T f  8* i" c  t“ t' f  t~

For Sale
INDUSTRIAL BLOG IN EASTLAND

Approx. 29,000 aq . H., mofal 8 stwol consfruaion. 

with concrot* floor 8 niew front officM. Approx. 96,000 

sq . ft. povod parking, noar RR, on pavwd rood, clos« in. 

In addition to your own business, there is excellent 

income opportunity, as well os room to expand.

A lease for port of the facilities is being negotiated. 

Call for appt. ond more information.

BIG COUNTRY REAL ESTATE
442-1693 or 442-1707 eves. M S

Oil It Where You Rnd It ...

..... so sayeth the oilmen. So is love, happiness, success and all of the
other elements that make up our lives. Where do you go to find title in­
formation? Not on the street comer or the barber shop or any othe 
place except in an abstract office. Yes, we have it, compiled, indexeo 
and assembled daily, from the very beginning down to the present 
time, plus years of experience and training. Visit us soon and let us 
have an opportunity to serve you.

Eostkmd County Abstroct Company
Abstracts ond TMo insurance

Pot ond Annelle Miller

i8i7)6iv-i387 8 c CMsmciHn conpaai
^ (817)647-1771 Bob Caroli, Owner

Hwy 80 West 
Ranger, Texas

D o z e rs
Maintainers
Scrapers
Frac Tanks
Bockhoe
Forklift
Vacuum Trucks 
Roustabout Crews 
Winch Trucki 
Driveway Pipe

Portable Welders 
Front End Loaders 
Air Compressor & Drill 
For Rock Locations 
Oilfield Roods &
Locations
All Types of Dirt Work 
Heavy Houiing KRC permits 
rill uir*
Crushed Rocf
Disposal Well

'̂‘ww & Used Oilfield pipe
ft supplies

SEHVIM0 ftAITiAMP COUNTY SINCE 1956 
riooiiy rotes or controct basis

T-l*

frfffmnmnnE
Fully insured

mmÊrÉMâHmuiMâÊMuuÊi



Muon Warranty J n o  
Gary Maynard To Jantct Walker 

Quit Claim Deed
Harold Martindale To Jainae H. 

GlanvUle. Tr BUI M Sale 
Calvin Graham Milllcan Jr. To 

Calvin G. Milllcan. Sr li Wife Warran­
ty Deed

Paulme Martin 4  Othen To The 
PubUc A ff  dt

Naomi M. Martin, Dec'd To The 
PubUc C/C ProbaU 

Mary A. Townaend Manriquei To 
Nolan M Butler 4  Wife Warranty 
Dead

Calvin Michelaon To Natl Bk of 
Commercc-San Antomo Amend. D-t 

Billy Ray McBeth To The PubUc 
Proof of Heirahip

WilUam A McCaU 4  Wife, Dee d To 
The Public Proof of Heirship 

James NoeU 4 Wife. Dec'd To The 
Public Proof of Heirship 

L. A Noell 4 Wife To Cecil Everton 4 
(Hhers Warranty Deed 

OIney Savings Assn To Richard 
Bruce Pipkin 4  Wife Rel Deed of trust 

Ronald Ray Owens 4 Wife To 1st 
NaU Bk-Gorman Deed of trust 

Dale Petree 4  Wife To J D Taylor 4 
Wife Deed

Gwen Dale Pruitt To 1st Natl Bk- 
Gonnan Deed of trust 

DC Pratt, flec'd To The Public 
Aff'dl

Mary I. Pratt, Dec'd To The Public 
Aff'dl

W C Pratt, Dee d To The Public 
AH'dl

Charles A Pratt To Jerry D Pratt 4 
Others Power of Atty.

Roy C Pratt To Jerry D Pratt 4 
Others Power of Atty 

Rodney Wayne Roberts 4  Others To 
1st Natl Bk. Gorman Deed of trust 

Homer T Robinson 4 Wife To Buddy 
W Kirkpatrick 4 Wife Contract 

Ben Rollins To Cecil Everton 4 
Others Warranty Deed 

Howard D Roper To William VI 
Johnson 4  Wife Rel Deed of trust 

Gretchen T Gholson Roy, Dec'd To 
The Public All'dt

W R ReveU. Jr Dee d To The 
Public Proof of Heirship 

H4J Oevviopment 'To The Public 
Corp Res

R IJ  Development To Scnkel Con­
struction Warranty Deed 

Thomas M Savage To Verba Odene 
Savage Power of Atty 

Verba 0  Savage To The Public Aff't

Power of Attv.
Clyde Williams, dba To Capital 

MarkeUng Co F/S

fis t Dial Ceurt
Delbert OrvU Naylor Speeding 
Mildred Naykir Speeding 
William Belyew Ran Red Light 
Bobby Coughran Speeding 
Kyle Landrum Nison Speedmg 
Robert Carl England Speeding 
Jerry Duane Pratt Spewing 
Phillip Joe Hamson Speeding 
Charlie Perkins Criminal Trespass 

of a Habitation
Weldon G Warner Posession of 

Manjuana Less than ]  ounces 
Billy Raymond Brown DWl 
Steve Douglas McBee OWI 
Clifford E Butler Speeding 
linda Ann Hughes DWI 
Birdsong Peanuts vs Vann’s Candy, 

Inc Damages
Johnny Robert Whisenant vs Paula 

Ruth Whisenant Divorce 
Diamond Shanorock Corp vs Ada 

Williams or her unknown heirs 
Receivership

Jerry Bragg vs Q> de Stanley Boose 
Bill of Review

Mrs Melba Opel Edwards 4 Others 
vs Donald E Miller Injunction 

Rea Dawain Pierte v s T e i Dept of 
Public Safety Judicial Review

Charles V Burkett 4  Wife To Teresa 
D. Koen 4  Others Warranty Deed 

F.U Bourland, Jr. To J.A HoweU 4 
Wife Warranty Dead 

Gaylor Battenf leld 4 WUe To Elbert 
lindley 4 Wife Warranty Deed 

Joseph Buckhetmer 4  Others, Dec'd 
To The Public Proof of Heirship 

Mercy A Rainsey Carl 4 Others To 
Geo S Gailbraith OGML 

BtUy D Carlton 4 Wife To Loper 
Mortgage Co. Deed of trust

James F. Clem Ind 4  others To 
LelandW Carter OGML 

W H Cooper To M4M Drlg Co. OGL 
Alden Cathey 4 Others To First Natl 

Bk-Cisco Deed of trust 
Centerre Trust Co. of St Louis To 

Deborah 0  Dunn Marrs M/D 
Ethel Gooch Clemmer To The Public 

C-C Proof of Heirship 
Coruiie Cloud 4 Husband. Dec'd To 

The Public C-C Proof of Heirship 
Bobby Carlton 4  Wife To K M  

Turner 4  Wife Deed of trust 
lands Butler Copeland 4 Wife To 1st 

Natl Bk, B ridge Deed of trust 
Jackie L. Daniels 4 Wife To F W 

Burger, Inc OGML 
Dwothy J Dunn To The Public 

Aff'dt

New Vehicle Regliteratloas 
C P Ingram Ford Pu Cisco 
Bilbo Wire lane Ser Ford Bronco 

Abilene
W Cole/Helen L Tollotson Solitaire 

HT Cross Plains
James A Thackerson Yamaha MC 

Eastland
Janet L Eaton Yamaha MC 

Eastland
John A Schaal Ford }  Dr Cisco 
Ross T/Morgan-Jean Moran Chev 

Pu Eastland
Gary .Snapp Chev Sub Eastland 
John H Webb Merc 4 Dr Cisco 
L.H Pearson GMC Pu Ranger

4 Dr

Verba O Savage. Ind 4  Others To 
Rodney Wayne Roberts Warranty 
Deed

Southwest Slate Bank To Derrell 
White 4 Wife Rel MMI.

Sound Around, Inc To Stereo Cci>- 
tral Inc Ahstrart of Judg 

Stcphcnville Cr As.sn To Jack 
Burkholder 4 Wife Par Rel D-T 

Stephenville Cr Assn To Fed land 
Bk of Tesas Trans MMI.

Brad .Stephenson To K l„  lasater 
A.sgn OKH

Dr Clifford A Swayic 4  Wife To 
Natl Bk of Commercr-Dallas Deed of 
trust

Jerry Squires 4 Wife To Geo E 
Brown 4 Wile (.'ontract 

Harry M .Shkiar To Thi- Public Cer­
tified Copy Probate 

Paul G Spinmg Jr To lillian C. 
,S(>Hiiiig M/D

Itugcr L. Stephenson To Saundra H 
.SteplH-nson Asgn URR 

Tes Employment Comm. To Jack 
l„  Brown Abstract of Judgment 

llir ifl Mart To Capitol Marketing 
Corp F/S

Kila C Wilhelm To Debbie J Chns- 
tuin Warranty IK-ed 

M A White 4  Wife To Carl E. Penn- 
uigtiHi 4 Wife Warranty I>ecd 

J N Weatherly 4 OUters, Dec'd To 
The I 'ublK- Proof of Heirship 

Billy B Walker 4 Wife To Gwen 
Ikile 1̂ 0111 Warranty Deed 

Gbdys Jean Walker To Russell S. 
Walker Warranty Deed 

Jim l„  Webb 4 Wile To Walter G 
Hall 4 Wife Warranty DtH-d 

K.hn Waile To Lula Mae Bryan

Edward L. Jordan Pont 
Hanger

Bobby Guy Emfinger Ford Pu. 
Eastland

C M Caraway 4  Sons Chev Pu. 
Delieon

Hugh W Bynum Chev 2 Dr Plano 
Terry Ceye Chev Pu. Gorman 
Monty Ancinec DVM Chev Pu. 

ayde
Bruce L. Williams Chev Pu Baird 
Don Reeves Ford Pu Cross Plains 
Mike A Knott Chev Sub Eastland 
Elisabeth Sandlin Olds 4 Dr. Carbon 
James McCormick Ford 3 Dr 

Eastland
Chem-Well Oilfield Products Ford 

FlaL Llastland
Wheels, Inc Chev Pu Stokie, III 
Jere lawrence GMC Utl. Sweet­

water
V W MctTlanahan Ford Pu Cisco 
Bill Richardson Chev 2 Dr Ranger

and

Court House News-Feb. II 
Marriage Urease

Stephen Edward Hallmark 
Virginia Ruth Miller 

Gaylon Joe Morrow and Dons 
Rubertie Cooper

Alvm I-ee Thompson and Debra Sue 
Hogue

Johnny Chris Justice and Usa 
Jolene Roberson

C Norman Evans To Windmill Corp 
Asgn CXIL

Eastland Natl Bank To Centerpoint 
Enterprises Part Rel Deed of Trust 

Eastland Natl Bank To Rudy Parker 
4 Wife Part Rel Deed of trust 

W H Ford 4 Wife To W B Norton 4 
others OGL

First Natl Bk. Cisco To Royce White 
Kel Deed of trust 

F David Ford 4 Wife To W B 
Norten 4  Wife OGL 

1st St Bk-Rising Star To Ceal Bes- 
sent Abstract of Judg 

1st St Bk. Ranger To First Natl Bk. 
B'ridg- Trans. D/T 

A A Gilliland, Dec'd To The Public 
A ff’dt

Dora Helen Perkins Gtlliand, Dec'd 
To The Public Proof of Heirship 

Mrs B O. Grant To Gene M Snow 
(XIML

S.C. Guthne 4  Wife To Republic Bk 
of Brownwood Deed of trust 

Charlie L. Garrett To Harwui D 
Cook Supplemental OGL 

Charlie L. Garrett 4  Wife To The 
Pubbe Aff'dt

Daiuiy D Hutton To FmHA Asgn 
Alvanne Hartuga To Gene M Snow 

OGML
Elisabeth Harris To Roy N Iley 4 

Wife Deed of trust 
Joseph L. Hanegan 4 Wife To J B. 

Jessup 4  Wife Deed of trust 
J A Howell 4 W ife To F U 

Bourland, Jr Deed of trust 
G.L. Ingram To E.E Ingram War­

ranty Deed
Roy N Iley 4  Wife To Elisabeth A. 

Harris Warranty Deed 
F-thleen M Johnson To Junmy 

(harles Johnson 4 Wife Warranty 
Deed

Joseph W Johnson To Joe Smith 4 
Wife Warranty Deed 

Bormie Johnson, Rec’ r 29.S29 To 
H P  Wells. Inc OGML 

J.B. Jessup 4  Wife To Joseph L. 
Hanegan 4 Wife Warranty Deed 

Bessie liee Jones To The Public

Estate Tas Closing Letter 
Mrs l-ena Kruemckc by Agent To 

Gene M Snow OGML 
Teresa D Kosn 4  Others To 1st Natl 

Bk-Gorman Deed of trust 
Kahan Elnergy Corp To Eastland 

Natl Bk Sub To Agree.
Elisabeth Williams Langston To 

Bruce Berry. Tr. Corr. OGL 
HH  Lamby 4 Wife To CUyton 

Briggs OGL
Calmile Avinger Lee To Jim L 

Webb 4  Wife Rel Deed of trust 
Rebecca Lee Rhodes Lse 4 others 

To Guatnmitta Jo Rhodes Certified 
Copy Quit Claim Deed 

Lucy Mills, Dsc'd To The Public 
Agree Not to Probate 

Charles E Mills 4 others To C B. 
Mills Power of Atty 

Linnie Montgomery To Mane Cook 
Warranty Deed

Calvin Graham MiUican Sr 4  Wife 
To 1st St Bk-Rising Star Deed of trust 

Alile Mickle To Nan Lanford Power 
of Atty

Missouri 4 Pacific RR Co. To 
Ranger Industrial Foundation Deed 

Jack McElmurry To SO Operating 
Co. Asgn OGL

Franklin S McGowen to Gene M 
Snow OGML

Joyce McDowell To Richard 
Schkade Power of Atty.

William L. McGehee To Verna M 
McGehee Power of atty 

Verna Mae McGehee To Jayanti M 
Nathu Warrar'v Deed

Court of 
Qvll Appeals

The following proceedings 
were had in the Court of Ap­
peals, Eleventh Supreme 
Judicial District of Texas; 
AFFIRMED

11-81-017-CR Robert Gar­
cia Prado V. State of Texas. 
(Opinion by Judge Dicken­
son) Taylor

11-81-03(K:R William Mack 
Landers v. State of Texas. 
(Opinion by Judge Dicken­
son) Taylor

11-81-074-CR Jerry  
Williams V. State of Texas. 
(Opinion by Judge Dicken­
son) Dallas

11-81-096-CR Anita Banks 
V. State of Texas. (Opinion 
by Judge McCloud) Dallas

11-61-129-CR Charles Ray 
Hammons v. State of Texas. 
(Opinion by Judge McCloud) 
Dallas

11-81-149-CR Jimmy Ray 
Slayton v. State of Texas. 
(Opinion by Judge McCloud) 
Taylor

IwtrumrwU FUrd-C'o. CIcrk'i Office 
Claude W Barker To Tracy J Hayi 

4 Others M/D
Broken Bell Trade Corp. To T.B.* 

Davis Asgn OGL
Clemens R. Brooks 4  Wife Ts 

William Campbell 4 others OGML 
Tura Modess Burgess To Durwood 

Hay Burgess Warranty Deed 
Tura Modess Burgess To Gary Dale 

Burgess Warranty Deed 
Tura Modess Burgess To Joyce Ann 

Pence Warranty Deed 
eleo Barnhill To t-;astland Com- 

mi'oitv Dare Care Quit Claim Deed

;  JOB WANTED *.
2 Oilfield Executive Secretary •
•Too »kill*. 25 v«or« «K o w r ia n c *  In oil photM of tha industry a 

J Avoilobla Immadiotaly. Coll ond laova mastoga at ^
teeeewe2**eMeww^^''^®^ avanhjj^^Ond J

O . L .  R o d g e r s
8 1 7 / 4 4 2  3133

H u L T IV E R S d L
PIPE COMPANY

t'asmg'Tubing-Drill Pipe-Sucker Hods 
Polyethylene Pipe 4  Equipnteni

^ C Bo> 83 I 
E s s t l a n o . T a sA S  7 8 44 8

T/vr

Bua. P monb 
8 1 7 / 8 ^ - 8 9 8 1  

OR 8 1 7 / 8 2 9 - 2 6 8 2

MACHINE SHOP
Precision Machining 

ARC EGAS HELIARC 
Welding

IIII
T-16 ¿TJ-D 'Jlliiit* '  y y iE lL lL

Shallow Oil & G as W ells 
Water Wells 

All Cable Tool Drilling
Ranger Texas 

647-J884
Lee Sigert 

License 2184

11-81-157-CV In Re: Baby 
Girl S., A Child. (Opinion by 
Judge Brown) Taylor 

11-81-166-CR Kenie Sim­
mons McCord v State of 
Texas. (Opinion by Judge 
Brown) Taylor 
APPEALS DISMISSED 

5658 Don H. Hanvey Oil In­
terests, Inc. v. C.B. Hazel, 
Inc. Stephens 

11-82-002-CV Terra Of New 
Mexico, Inc. et al v. Com­
mand Energy Corporation. 
Eastland
MOTIONS SUBMITTED & 
GRANTED

5658 Don H. Hanvey Oil In­
terests, Inc. V. C.B. Hazel, 
Inc. Agreed motion to 
dismiss appeal. Stephens 

11-81-029-CR Glen Hulen 
Tate V. State of Texas. Ap­
pellee's motion for extension 
of time to file brief. Palo Pin­
to

11-81-181-CV Short Stops of 
Texas, Inc. d/b/a Mart’s 
Short Stops V. Atlantic & 
Gulf States Insurance Com­
pany, et al. Appellee’s (Tom 
Hardin) motion for exten­
sion of time to file brief. Palo 
Pinto

11-81-181-CV Short Stops of 
Texas, Inc. d/b/a Mart’s 
Short Stops V. Atlantic & 
Gulf States Insurance Com­
pany, et al. Appellees’
( Broaddus, Foster, etc. ) mo­
tion for extension of time to 
file brief. Palo Pinto 

11-81-183-CR Charles S. 
Lockard v. State of Texas. 
Appellee’s motion to amend 
record. Taylor 

11-82-002-CV Terra Of New 
Mexico, Inc., et al v. Com­
mand Energy (Corporation. 
Appellee’s motion to dismiss 
for want of jurisdiction. 
Eastland

11-82-008-CV George A. 
Ramirez v. Beatrice Garza. 
Appellant’s motion for ex­
tension of time to file state­
ment of facts. Scurry 

11-81-015-CV Muhammed 
All and Bahadurali Kar- 
mahli V. Aline Benge. Ap­
pellants’ motion for exten­
sion of time to file record. 
Erath

9t. 3 Box 167 Cisco Tx I
Albany Hwy 76437 |j Phone 442-3805 Anytime 4 4 2 -^ 3 ^

AtRlAt'BUCKET TRUCKS S  MOU OlOGCRS •  DI1CM D IG « * «

CAtkOLL ELECTRIC SERVICE CO/ c \ e l e c t r ic a l  m a in t e n a n c e  c o n s t r u c t io n

/  Í  \ OIL T tL D  COMME*10AL 4 RESt«N TIA L

/  *  '
\  (C / P O  BOK »91

V* / EASTLANO TEXAS TSAAS
B u s 8 l 7i629 2S42

629-8793

RON C A R R O LL  O W N ER N ighl 629-1320

JIREH ENTERPRISES
01 FloM Assistanca Sorvict 

Roustabout • Wtneh Truck • Bockboo • 
Loodtr • WtMbig • Tanks Pointad 

Box 129 Oscoy TX 44MS2t
JESUS IS LORD T-c

K&S Equipment & 
MacMne Co.

Precision 
Machining 

& Welding

Compressor 
Valve 
Repair 
A Soles

ÌL109 N Mam 
Rising Star 76471

All Types 
Gas

Compressors 

A Equipment

S A S DRILLING CO
o i l  8  U 8S

Reuta 4

C IS C O . TEXAS 76417

BILL 6ARY

442-30a
LIE STAkk

442-3226 J

P O  Box 426
Ph. (817) 643-3177

ROUSTABOUT CWWS. WMCH TRUCKS BIXIOOSR BACKH« 
WCUXR. RM« TRAkJER. TANK IKIO& EXTRA LONO ROUES

T r ip le  S R o u s t a b o u t  S e rv ic e , I n c .  
r u u r  iNSUKD *  iQ u im o

iMinMi FfwMt (»17) F3S-4332 ar 77S-77H

RO aok tn
CROSS RtAMS TEXAS T8443

KanrMh Sovvall (BIT) 72S-7444 
Stuart SowBH (BIT) 72S-7S2ft

T «

v\()RDof(;on
Therefore if any 

man be in Christ he 
is a new creature; 
old things are 
pa s s e d  a wa y ;  
behold, all things 
are become new.

II  Corinthians 5:17

NBC
NEWS/MUSICEWS/MUS

FM97
RADIOS 24 HOURS I

Introfducnon To Camelliar,
by Ted Brice, The Garden Ekiltor

Studying the history of the 
camellia, you will find the 
natural camellia belt along 
the coast of China and the of­
fshore islands including 
Japan and Foremosa.

In 1948, tw enty plus 
v a r ie t ie s  of cam e llia  
reticulata were introduced 
to the United States from the 
vacinity of Running in the 
province of Yunan, China. 
The camellia belt extends 
from cold areas of Korea in 
the North to the Semi- 
tropical area of Indo-China 
in the South.

One story about the 
camellia introduction to the 
western world involves the 
Tea plant which is a close 
relation to the camellia. 
Around 1700 a British 
Trading Company commis­
sioned one of its sea captians 
who was leaving for China to 
bring back specimans of 
China’ s Tea plant. The 
British were planning on 
growing Tea in Europe and 
thus eliminating the expen­
sive time-consuming and 
hazardous trip to the Orient 
for Tea.

China, how ever, was 
aware of what would happen 
if they let their tea plants get 
to Europe. They gave the sea 
capta in  ornam ental 
camellias as tea plants. This 
is reported to be the in­
troduction of Japónicas to 
England.

The botanical classifica­
tion of which the camellia 
belongs is called Theaceae. 
The camellia is one of six­
teen genera of this family. 
The camellia is the only 
genus of this family of major 
ornam ental im portance, 
measured by their populari­
ty, the japónicas, the sasan- 
quas and the retículas.

MOTIONS SUBMITTED & 
OVERRULED 

5668 Betty Jo Welch v. 
T exas  E m p loyera ’ in ­
surance Association. Ap­
pellee’s second motion for 
rehearing. Nolan 

11-81-148-CR Robert Ray 
Dickinson v. State of Texas. 
A ppe llan t’ s motion for 
rehearing. Brown 
CASES SUBMITTED Ml-82 

11-81-060-CV G eorge 
Trenholm , Jr. v. B.J 
T idwell Industries, Inc 
Dallas

11-81-049-CJV Ciryle Lynn 
Gage V. Mary Dorothy Gage- 
Newton Dallas 

11-81-110-CR Doris Olene 
Adams v. State of Texas. 
Dallas

11-81-122-Cn Elaine Wood­
ward Suwannum v. State of 
Texas. Dallas

R E V E R S E D  &
RENDERED 

11-81-068-CV M alcolm  
Turner et ux v. Richard W. 
England, M .D. et al. 
(Opinion by Judge Dicken­
son) Dallas
MOTIONS SUBMITTED & 
GRANTED

11-61-014-CR Glen Wayne 
Baker v. State of Texas. Ap­
pellee’s motion for leave to 
file late brief. Taylor 
MOTIONS SUBMITTED & 
OVERRULED 

11-81-128-CR Tommy Gene 
Wood V. State of Texas Ap­
pellant’s motion for rehear­
ing. Dallas 
CASES SUBMITTED 

11-81-080-CR Annie Marie 
Scott V. State of Texas. 
Dallas

11-81-107-CR Selman 
McDowell V. State of Texas. 
Dallas.

Japónicas, being the most 
popular, are therefore con­
sidered to be the most impor­
tant by many growers. 
There are several thousand 
named varieties of the 
Japónicas. The Japónica has 
a uniform growing habit and 
superior foliage and flower. 
You will find the simple five 
petal single to the most com­
plete double camellia.

In Japónica species you 
will also find the widest 
range of colors pink, rose, 
red, chalk white and blushes. 
The Japónica has the longest 
blooming season due to the

□ub
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large number of varieties. 
You can have a continuous 
bloom up to six months from 
late fall to late spring with 
Japónicas. This is good for 
landscaping giving the yard 
and garden color when they 
are bare in the winter.

The foliage of the Japónica 
looks as if it has been waxed, 
making its appearance far 
superior to the other 
varieties. The Japónica 
bloom is noted for its diversi­
ty, formality and lasting 
qualities. 'The bloom size 
varies from minature or 
boutonniere (under two in­
ches in diameter) to semi­
double ranging up to seven 
inches across.

The Japónica can attain a 
height up to thirty feet with a 
compatible spread under 
favorable conditions. An old 
estate in California has 
Japónicas that are eighty- 
five years old, thirty-one feet 
tall and have a thirty-eight 
foot spread with a trunk 
diameter of twelve and one 
half inches.

Sasanquas have several 
hundred varieties and colors 
available. The Sasanqua has 
small blooms that make up 
for their size with a mass ef-

fect that cannot be surpass­
ed by any other flower of the 
plant kingdom in the eyes of 
camellia growers. Their 
bloom is very similar to an 
azalea bloom and has been 
referred to as the “ azalea”  
of the camellia world. They 
begin blooming early in the 
fall about the same time 
Chrysanthemums and last 
till frost.

So long for now until next 
week and GOOD GARDEN­
ING from your GARDEN 
EDITOR, Ted Brice.
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Try Us A l Too Can Sovo Is MONEr/fl

With fairer weather on 
hand our attendance for our 
February tourney was ex­
cellent. We fished on Palo 
Pinto l4ike. Fishing was ex­
tremely slow with only one 
11 inch fish being taken by 
Jerry Bollinger. Jerry won 
our C^lcuttoe Pot for the 
day.

Our days are slowly warm­
ing and fishing should begin 
a noticeable upswing. We 
hope everyone will make our 
next meeting. This club is 
con tro lled  by you the 
member so everyone plan to 
attend March 4th at the con­
ference room of the Cisco 
Bank. Good Fishing.

Terry Wilson

T.,3  I
XERXES CORPORATION • A SLJBSiDiARV OF PROFORM INC

Fiberglass Oilfield Tanks nnd 
Gunbarrei Seperators
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Peanuts Plentiful Again
Remember the peanut 

shortage two years ago when 
the price of peanut butter 
went out of sight and it and 
other peanut products were 
hard to find at the super- 
ntarket?

Well, the situation has 
done an about-face following 
a bumper peanut crop in 
1981, says Johnny Feagan, 
economist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, Texas A8tM University 
System.

Just look at the number. 
Total peanut stocks last 
November at 2.87 billion 
p )̂unds were up 72 percent 
from a year earlier and 
shelled peanut supplies were 
up 94 percent. That's good 
news for peanut butter 
lovers and those who enjoy 
roasted peanuts and other 
peanut snacks, says Feagan 

Faced  with a good 
dom estic  demand for 
peanuts which will keep 
prices strong, farmers in 
Texas and other peanut- 
producing states plan to 
plant about the same 
number of acres this year as 
HI 1981, notes the economist. 
And most will have to take 
their chances on the open 
market rather than contrac­
ting their crop.

Peanuts grown under the 
national poundage quota set 
by the S ecre ta ry  of 
Agriculture will enjoy a 
price support of $550 per ton 
during the new four-year 
farm program. However, the 
support price will be increas­
ed annually based on in­
creased production costs not 
to exceed 6 percent.

Under the new farm pro­
gram, traditional acreage 
a llo tm en ts have been 
eliminated, allowing anyone 
to grow peanuts, says 
Feagan. However, farmers 
with allotments will be able 
to grow peanuts under the 
poundage that is tied to the 
price support program

Plans call for the national 
poundage quota to be reduc­
ed from the current 1.2 
nrullion tons to 1.1 million 
1985 According to the 
economist, farmers with 
quotas who have not grown 
peanuts in recent years will 
be the first to suffer cut­
backs

A support price for non­
quota peanuts is still to be 
set by the Secretary of 
Agriculture based on pro­
jected world market prices 
for peanuts and peanut pro­
ducts. That price will be at a 
rate that would result in no 
cost to the government.

CAPITOL 
UPDA TE
I  .S. A TO R  for TK X  AS
U2 HI SSt.Ll OKKU;i: HI II.IMM,
» 4SHI V .T tlN . D.C 20510

BEAUTIFUL, NEW 
APARTMENTS FOR RENT

Two, clean One-bedroom 
apartments available immediately.«

Double insuloted windows. Fully 
insulated throughout. Dishwosher.«

)isposal. Electric Range. Wired for« 

telephone ond television cable in «

each room. FuNy droped. Ideally *
«

located. W ater, sewer, trash and «

T.V . cable paid. 

Call 629-1010. Tf

Four score and seven years ago our fathers brought 
forth on this continent, a new nation, conceived in 
Liberty, and dedicated to the proposition that all 
men are created equal.
Now we are engaged in a great civil war, testing 
whether that nation or any nation so conceived and 
so dedicated, can long endure. We are met on a 
great battle-field o f that war. W'e have come to 
dedicate a portion o f that field, as a final resting 
place for those who here gave their lives that that 
nation might live. It is altogether fitting and proper 
that we should do this.
But, in a larger sense, we can not dedicate -  we can 
not consecrate — we can not hallow — this ground. 
The brave men, living and dead, who struggled 
here, have consecrated it, far above our poor power 
to add or detract. The world will little note, nor 
long remember what we say here, but it can never 
forget what they did here. It is for us the living, 
rather, to be dedicated here to the unfinished work

TEXAS PRESS 
ASSOCIATION \V ()R D o fC ;O I)

For husbands only:

FEBRUARY FEED SPECIALS
Iff* PMiM ammBi iainc fw just

BREEDER CUBES 1162 Ion

Husbands, lova youryc
wWos, even as Christ
also loved the church, 
and gave himself for It;

That he might sanctify 
and cleanse It with the 
washing of water by the 
word.

12* CREEP PELLETS“’“"'132 ton
14% STEER FEED RED CHAIN M40ton

That he might present It 
to himself a glorious 
church, not having spot, 
or wrinkle, or any such 
thing, but that It should 
be holy and without 
blemish.

PEANUT HAY PEllETS >110 ton
So ought men to love 

their wives as their own 
bodies He that loveth 
his wife loveth himself.

H ere's a Popular
DRY COW 

& HEIFER MIX
600  Lbs. P e a n u t Hay 
600 Lbs. Corn 
600 Lb s. P ean u t Hulls 
160 Lb s. P ean u t M eal 

20 Lbs. Salt 
20 Lb s. Minerals 

1 Lb. Vitamin ADE

For no man ever yet 
hated his own flesh; but 
n o u r i s h e t h  and  
cherlsheth it, even as the 
Lord the church :

For we are members of
his body, of his flesh, 
and of his bones

For this cause shall a 
man leave his father and 
mother, and shall be 
joined unto his wife, and 
they two shall be one 
flesh

Ephtsians 5:25-31
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which they who fought here have thus far so nobly 
advanced. It is rather for use to be here dedicated to 
the great task remaining before us — 
that from these honored dead we take increased 
devotion to that cause for which they gave the last 
full measure o f devotion -- that we here highly 
resolve that these dead shall not have died in vain -  
that this nation, under God, shall have a new birth 
o f freedom -  and that government o f the people, 
by the people, for the people, shall not peiish from 
the earth.

Abraham Lincoln was not only one o f our nation’ s 
greatest President’ s, but also one o f our most eloquent. As 
the anniversary o f his birth approaches, much will be said 
to honor this great leader and statesman.

Yet, his own words are a far better tribute than any we 
can devise. It is a tribute to the greatness o f Abraham 
Lincoln that his observations about people and their 
government hold true now as they did when they were 
made five score years ago. I would like to share just a few 
o f his statements which are well worth remembering now:

“ The dogmas o f the quiet past are inadequate to the 
stormy present. The occasion is piled high with 
difficulty, and we must rise with the occasion. As 
our case is new, so we must think anew, and act 
anew”

“ The legitimate object o f government is to do for a 
community o f people whatever they need to have 
done, but cannot do at all, or cannot so well do, for 
themselves, in their separate and individual 
capacities. In all that the people can indiv idually do 
as well for themselves, government ought not to 
interfere”

“ The maintenance inviolate o f the rights o f the 
States, and especially the right o f each state to order 
and control its own judgment exclusively, is 
essential to that balance o f powers on which the 
perfection, and endurance o f our political fabric 
depends.”

“ This government must be preserved in spite o f the 
acts o f any man or set o f men. It is worthy o f your 
every effort. Nowhere in the world is presented a 
government o f so much liberty and equality. T o  the 
humblest and poorest amongst us are held out the 
highest privileges and position.”

■And finally, the Gettysburg address lives on as one o f 
the most moving tributes to the principles which bind us 
together.

1 he President’ s budget proposal for the next fiscal 
year reflects two basic commitments -  to control and 
where possible reduce the amount o f federal spending, and 
to rebuild our national defense capability to a level which 
w ill enable us to defend our v ital interests in the world.

The defense portion o f the fiscal year 1983 budget is 
undeniably large, with spending projected to be S215.9 
billion. Bui its merit should not be judged merely on its 
siie. The validity o f the budget proposal must be deter­
mined by the contrihuticn it makes to our nation’ s ability 
to meet its defense needs, and the extent to which it uses 
the taxpayers’ money efficiently.

Clearly our defense needs are great. NVe are forced to 
increase the level o f spending for national defense now 
because we neglected that area in favor o f domestic 
programs in past years. During that period, the Soviet 
Union increased its military investment. Thus, our 
capability relative to that o f the Soviet Union deteriorated 
to an alarming degree. W e began last year to redress these 
deficiencies, but must continue that effort this year and for 
the next few years.

Y'et, even the magnitude o f our needs does not give the 
military a blank check. Our dollars are finite, and our 
validated requirements are many. That means that we in 
Congress, and the Administration, have a special ob li­
gation to make certain that every dollar spent contributes 
the maximum amount possible to our defense.

The Defense Department has made an excellent start 
in this regard. During the past year, it has initiated a series 
of programs and actions to improve efficiency and man­
agement in the department.

1 hese include a reform of the strategic planning, pro­
gramming and budget process; reform o f the process by 
which weapons systems are acquired; a major attack on 
fraud, waste and abuse; economies and efficiencies in a 
number o f internal management operations, and creation 
o f a .Management Improvement Council.

Thus the budget which has been presented to us 
reflects new efficiencies. It also reflects the Defense 
Department’ s determination to budget realistically to 
reflect actual cost and inflation factors. This approach in 
some cases provides higher figures now, but these amounts 
are much less likely to be subject to cost overruns later.

1 am confident that the budget the Administration has 
sent to the Congress reflects its officials best efforts to use 
each dollar wisely. However, Congress still has an ob li­
gation to scrutinize each aspect o f the budget.

As the Armed Services Committee begins examining 
the defense request, we will not approve programs which 
are not cost-effective. This has been the case in past years.

and we will he especially vigilant this year. VN e also will be 
looking very closely at the procedures and management 
systems embodied in the proposal provide maximum 
efficiency.

On behalf o f the committee, I already have requested 
the Ciovernmeni Accounting O ffice  lo audit several o f the 
Defense Department’ s money-saving programs I also have 
requested G.AO to review compliance on cost overrun 
reports.

In addition, 1 have asked the CiAO comptroller- 
general and his staff to provide further suggestion to the 
Armed Services Committee that will assist us in our 
scrutiny o f the budget.

You, the American citizen, are entitled to a strong 
national defense. In every poll, and in your letters and 
comments to me, you have reiterated your determination 
that your federal government should prov ide you with this 
strong defense.

But you also are entitled a program o f national 
defense which is free o f inefliciency and waste. We in 
Congress will work diligantly to make certain that you get 
both a strong and a cost-effective national security system. 
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One Showing Only Each Svanina 
Open 7:30 p.m,, Showtimo, 7:50 p.m.

Chevij has the tom ake
this Holiday Season 

the funniest ever!
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Coming SoonI

Nobody leans oo Sh arkys Machine.

BURT
REYNOLDS 
SHARKYS 

, MACHINE
R k i - omon~ o .

—

One Showing Only Each Evening 
Open 7:30 p.m. Showtime 8:00 p,m.

Fri., Sate, Sun.
Alone...Terrified...Trapped like an animal. 

Now ahe’a fighting back 
with the only weapon ahe haa...Heraelf!

Next Friday, Saturday, & Sunday

A llO W E E N  I
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Nightmare 
IsnY O ver!
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Fall & Winter 
Merchandise
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Boots
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Doing MORE...With LESS!

SAVE MONEY BY 
PAINTING 
YOUR HOUSE 
YOURSELF!

Here are a few hints that can make the chore of 
painting your house a little easier . . .  and allow you to 
have the satisfaction of doing a good job yourself, 
while saving money for more necessary—or enjoyable
—activities.

Before you begin, here are soma suggestions to help 
you estimate juat how much paint to buy for a given 
house painting job: II) Compute the number of square 
feet of surface to be covered. To do so, determine the 
distance around the houae, in feet, then find the aver­
age height to the eaves and add two feet to that figure. 
(This will allow for the paint you'll need for the gables.) 
L,ast. multiply the former result by the latter. (2) Ask 
your paint dealer approaimately how many square feet 
each gallon of undercoat will cover, then divide the to­
tal area of the house by this figure. (3) FinaUy, learn 
how much area a gallon of topcoat house paint will cov­
er and compute how much of that you’ll need. Here's 
an example: L.et's say your home is 20' by 40' with an 
average height to the eaves of 13'. By multiplying 120' 
(the perimeter) by 15' (the average height to the eaves 
plus 21, you’ll find that the surface area is about 1,800 
square feet. A  good grade of undercoat or primer 
should cover about 350 square feet per gallon, and a 
top-quality house paint covers 400 square feet per gal­
lon. A little simple arithmetic reveals that 5 gallons of 
undercoat and 4-1/2 of houae paint should do the job.

The first portion of your house painting task is sur­
face preparation, which usually involves scraping, 
sanding, aitd caulking . . .  with maybe a bit of priming 
here and there. It'll take about half a day for the aver­
age home.

Begin by hosing down the exterior surfaces, then 
scrape any peeling, cracked, or chipped spots. (Areas 
which are talten down to the bare wood should get a 
coat of primer.) Finally, replace any loose or missing 
putty around windows, and recaulk the window 
frames, doors, and chimneys as needed.

The second part of the chore is painting the trim and 
windows. The trim is usually easy, unless you've got 
an old house with overhanging eaves (wear a hat for 
this job). If you use care when painting the windows, 
you'll save time in the lung run, because you won't 
have to scrape the panes later on.

Then comes the main body of the houae . . .  which is 
the easiest part, because you can use a wide brush and 
make long strokes. For large, smooth areas you can try 
painting with an industrial roller. It holds a lot of paint 
and, in most cases, will cover as well as a brush . . .  but 
do so much more quickly.

Don't forget drying time . . .  allow at least 48 hours 
between coats.

The Bnal task is to clean up the yard area by gather­
ing stray paint chips, old caulking, and putty, and 
throwing them away. (Do a good job . . .  scraps of old 
paint can be ingest^ by children and cause lead poi­
soning.) Once you’ve finished, you can sit back and re­
lax, knowing you've done a thorough job and hedged 
yourself against inflation one more time!

H e a l t l i - W  i s e
UND ERSTANDING

ALLERGIES

Allan R. Magie, Pk.D.. M.P.H.

Sneezing, Wheezing. Itch­
ing. Weeping. An allergy? 
Ck>uld be. But before jumping 
to a conclusion you should 
consider a few facts about 
allergies. Too many today are 
willing to blame aJlergies for 
almost any discomfort they 
experience.

It's true that allergies are 
common. Probably as many as 
one out of every five persons 
regularly experience uncom­
fortable symptoms of an aller 
gy. The allergic response they 
feel is actually a defect in the 
immune system of the body to 
protect against an attack of 
microorganisms. The body tis­
sues simply overreact to for 
eign substances, which are 
otherwise harmless.

To see what happens when 
one experiences an allergic 
reaction let's follow the pollen 
grain as it comes into contact 
with the mucous lining of the 
nose. The pollen is coated 
with distinctive molecules—a 
unique blend of proteins.

If the person attached to 
the nose is allergic, antibodies 
that recognize these foreign 
molecules will be in the vicin­
ity attached to a oust cell. 
The antibodies stick to the
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CARBON UONS CLUB
FARM AUCTION

CONSIGNMENT SAU
Sat. Feb. 20-1982-10:00 A Z I

BIRDSONG LOT !N CARBON

1-970 C'*se Tractcr (V iry  Nice)
1-4R Cultivaf'jr 
1 -Case Grant 0 . ii’
1- Shop Made P', Slingei 
1 -Hat Bed Trailer
2- Evaporativ«.' c. jolctc- 
1-8 Ton ( iydrdi_''ii‘. Jack 
1 -Hay Fee je r  
100-Bales Ccaatal Hav 
1-liit 3 Bottom Mo'i-thoard
3- Wooden Teacher ucaks 
1-Squirrfei Cayie Fan and Mot?''
1-4R Row Markfc 
l-Adj 6 Blade (New)
1-2 Hole Hog Feace- 
1-6'' UlliSton 15C0 Peanut Combine 
1-M-Faivnall w w F & 3-Point
1-Hot Electric Fence Post. Wire & Insulator 
1 AC Combine. Butane, with 14' Header

1 -Set 34 " Snap-On Duals 
1 -1 ! Shank Chisel
1- 1968 GMC Truck
1 -Electric Welder (Wards)
2- Lil'iston 4R Rolling Cultivators 
1-Cent ''Aater Pump v  *F Gas Engine 
1 Case Rake
1 -Case 4 Be* j  ~ Mo'dbroard (14)
1- MF4 Bottom Moldboard-16
2- 220 Volt Electric Motors
7 Singer Electric Sewing Machines 
1 Jointer (No Motor)
1 2 Speed Port Sander & Polisher
1- AC 1 2' Tandem
2- Rolls Hog Wire (New)
1-560 Int Tractor

1 -Garden Tiller (Almost New)
1 -Roanoak 4R Peanut Digger 
1 -New Holland Rake 
Windows and Screens 
2-Electric Grain Augers (1 -1 O' & 1 -20' 
1 -Hi-Lift Jack 
1-2R Tiller
1-57 New Holland Grinder & Mixer 
1-MM2 Bottom Moldboard-14 
Various Office Machines 
1 -Scoreboard 
1-AC4R Row Marker 
1 -8'-3 Point Tandem 
1 -Lawn Edger with B & S Motor 
1-J D Concrete Mixer (3 Point)
1-300 Int Tractor (Parts)

1 - J  D 9 Shank Chisel 
1 -M Farmall with Int # 130 Cotton Stripper 
1-8N Ford Tractor with Front End Loader 
1 ■Supei' C w'w F & 3-Point (New Rubber)1-Tandem Axle Livestock Trailer (Covered)

Anyone Having items to Sell or Donate, Contact Carbon Lions 

Ronnie Pack, Day 817 • 6 3 9 -2  521 - Night 6 3 9 -2 4 8 0

Ken Norris 8 1 7 -6 3 9 -2 3 7 6  or Any Other Carbon Lions
Auctioneers — Fred Tucker - T X S -0 8 1 -1 1 5 2  and Jacky Gentry - TX S -1 2 2 -0 3 9 5

S e n a t o r  
L lo y d  B e n t s e n

W a tc h in g
W a s h in g to n

foreign molecules, with many 
quickly accumulating on the 
surface. This tr iggers  the 
mast cell to release histamine, 
as well as other substances.

Histamine causes the char­
acteristic itching and makes 
the tiny blood vessels (capil­
laries) swollen and leaky, 
causing the redness and swell­
ing associated with the aller 
gic response. Mast cells also 
release substances which con­
strict the air passages in the 
lungs, producing the charac­
teristic wheezing of asthma.

However it's just as impor 
tant to know what allergies 
are not. The inability to di 
gest a particular food in a 
normal way. while referred to 
as a food allergy, is not an 
allergic response. It has notlK 
ing to do with the function of 
the body's immune system. 
There are many irritants, 
such as chemicals, which pro­
duce discomfort but don't trig­
ger an allergic response.

This series of events, with 
individual variations, under 
lies every allergic reaction. 
But there are still many mys­
teries about allergies. Why, 
for instance, does one person 
get hay fever from ragweed, 
another develop eczema from 
exposure to milk, and yet an 
other get hives from seafood? 
These differences simply are 
not understood.

Of the little that is known, 
it has been established that a 
combination of factors must 
be present to bring it on: an 
inherited susceptibilty, expo­
sure to a foreign substance 
that acts as an allergen, and 
some kind of stress. That's all 
that's needed to get the ball 
rolling.
©by the Healtli Temperance Oe 
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Never ask of money spent
Where the spender thinks it went. '
Nobody was ever meant *
To remember or invent '
What he did wit h every cent.

Whether he had it in mind or not, poet Robert Frost’s whimsi­
cal defense of inept accounting was tailor-made for the federal' 
government. 1

I recently introduced legislation to improve government ac­
counting procedures by establishing Inspectors General to weed 
out waste and fraud within the Defense Department and other 
agencies.

My bill provides for Inspectors General with sweeping powers' 
to audit and investigate the Pentagon along with the Justice and' 
Treasury Departments and the Agency for International Develop-' 
ment. These agencies were excluded from a 1978 law which set up 
such positions within other government offices.

Last year, the House of Representatives gave resounding ap-' 
proval to legislation similar to mine. •

We have to spiend as much as it takes to insure that the United, 
Slates does not come out second best to any country in defense.  ̂
I continue to give all-out support to a strong defense as I have 
done since coming to the Senate. ,

But, while we must spend enough money to gel the job done, 
we must also make sure that our money is well-spent. ‘

I ’m pleased that the Reagan Administration agrees with my. 
views on this important issue and is supporting efforts to create 
these needed new positions. !

The Inspectors General would be “ in but not o f’ ’ the various 
government departments where they would operate. They would 
be authorized to perform internal audits and investigations, inde­
pendent o f the agencies.

The Defense Department Inspector General, for example, 
would be instructed to coordinate activities with those o f exist-: 
ing Inspectors General within the individual branches o f the U.S, 
Armed Forces.

Although the Administration is on record sup(>oriing the es 
lablishmeni o f Inspectors General, the departments affected, 
with the exception o f Treasury, arc opposing the legislation. , 

For decades, every Congress and every Administration that 
have come to Washington have worked to eliminate waste, fraud 
and abuse in government programs. To this point the efforts 
have met with limited success.

This idea, of naming independent Inspectors General with 
sweeping investigatory powers, holds forth great promise. I ’ ll 
push—and push hard—for quick enactment.

pxrtment of tlic General Conference 
of Seventh-day Adventists ss a com 
munity service.
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Brand 
Fashions

Thousands
O f

Garments
To Choose 

From

M i s s y ,  
H a l f  a  
Large S i z e s

Save 40-60%

New Arrivals 
Each Week

Open Mon.-Sat. 
9:00 a.m.-5:30 p.m.

112 N. Lanjar 
Eastland 
Next to 

Majestic 
Theater

PubHc opinioa surveys indicate that, as the recession deepens, 
tear o f unemployment is gradually overtaking concern about in­
flation in the minds o f the American people.

But down the road, as we move further into the decade o f the 
1980s, the major economic problem in this country may well be a 
shortage not o f jobs but o f workers, especially skilled workers.

It's ironic that, at a time when millions o f Americans are 
losing their jobs, a minimum of 250,000 skilled labor jobs have 
gone begging each year since 1978.

Labor Department projections for the period 1978-90 show 
there will be a yearly shortage o f 57,500 industrial machinery re­
pairmen, 28,000 computer operators, 21,300 machinists and 
19,000 licenied practic^ nurs6s, to mention but a few examples.

In the 13 occupations facing the most critical shortages during 
this period, the number o f trained workers will fall short o f de­
mand by some 2.5 million.

Our skilled labor shortage is forcing Amer-can rirms to spend 
billions o f dollars annually for stop-gap, in-house, on-the-job 
training. This shadow educational system is a patchwork quilt 
conceivably rivaling our entire higher education system in size.

According to studies I've worked on with the Joint Economic 
Committee, robots will help ease the skilled labor shortage that 
our country faces. But increased use o f robots will also cause 
some additional problems.

Right now, Japan leads the world in the manufacture and use 
o f robots—they have 11,000, over half o f the world’s supply. 
Our country has about 4,000 robots.

Whether we like it or not, the robot revolution is coming. We 
have no control over this; we’ re being pushed into robot produc­
tion because o f competition from other countries.

Robots can help to raise productivity, and do the dirty, danger­
ous, repetitive jobs. But we must also keep in mind that increased 
use o f robots can be expected to have some harmful conse­
quences and we must work to diminish their impact.

We must, for example, make sure that there are enough skilled 
workers to build, run and maintain these robots. And we must 
by all means take steps to provide the vocational education, the 
training that will be needed by workers who are displaced from 
their jobs by robots.

This anticipated increase in the use o f robots is but one facet of 
a skilled labor shortage that will lead to severe economic problems 
for our country later in this decade, if we fail to anticipate those 
problems and deal effectively with them.
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On Hwv. 6, Carbon 
Phonu*- 639-2426 
FREE ESTIAAATES 

Auto & truck glass 
installed and insurance claims 
promptly handled. We work on t-c  

American and Imported cars and trucks.
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7M W .RM i
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CAUTION
Hot Checks

m u  BURN!!!

T h e  i s s u a n c e  o f  h a d  o r  h o t  c h e c K s
ic  n i in is h a h le  h v  la w * * *

H E R E  A R E  T H E  F A C T S :
• A  worthless check written for less than 

could result in a 2̂00"̂  fine.
• A  worthless check written for from *5®® to *20®® 

could result in a l80-day iail sentence and/or a 
*1,000 fine.

• A  worthless check written for from *20®® to *200®® 
could result in a year in iail and/or a *2,000 fine

• A worthless check written for from *200 up to 
*10,000 could result in a prison sentence of
from 2 to lO years and/or a *s,000 fine.

Think Before You Write...
IS IT WORTH

THE RISK?
Sponsored as a Public Service by Your Local Hometown Newspaper



PA T M AYN ARD  
REA L ESTATE

INT. 20 E. NORTH SIDE
629-8568 EASTLAND

We are selling and we need your listings!
442-1880 Cisco

HOIVIÍ1S

IJke walking into a new home, this 2 bedroom, I 
bath older home has been completely remodeled. 
Carpeted, central heat and air, new, beautiful kitchen 
cabinets. $33,500.

2200 square feet in this 4 bedroom, icould be 5) P i  
bath brick home. Carpet, built-ins and a 400 ,sq. ft. 
master bedroom. Fenced back yard, large patio with 
Bar B-Q grill. All on a comer lot $82,500

Ideal l.rOcatlon! A 3 bedroom 2*2 bath home on 2*2 
lots. Approx. 2500 ,sq. ft., with built-ins, central heat 
and air, sprinkler system, fireplace, ceiling fans and 
many other extras. $76,000.

A 2 bedroom, 1 bath home that is carpeted, in­
sulated and with a fenced back yard. Included is a 
small apartment in back that is rented out. It needs 
some work, but is priced to sell at $16,500.

In Corman, a 3 bedroom, 1 bath home on two lots. 
Some carpet and paneling. Included also, are 2 ceil­
ing fans. $21,500.

An older 3 bedroom frame home on comer lot.
Needs some work done on it. Terms can be arranged. 
$16,000.

Want a new home? We have large lots available in 
exclusive area. City water, sower and paved streets. 
This area is restricted to brick homes, only. 
Reasonably priced from $4500 to $4800.

A large two story home. 5 bedrooms, large living 
and dining area. Some carpet. $25,000.

We have owner financed lots and others at I ¿ike 
l io o n .

ClStX) HOMF.S

A large 3 bedroom, 1 bath older home. All ro<>ms 
are large, separate dining area, and the bath has 
been remodeled. Also, a separate garage and storage 
area. $24,000.

Home plus result We liave 3 mobil homes on 7 lots 
in Cisco. Hookups for Iwo'more. All are rented right 
now. Priced to .sell. $23,000.

New vinyl siding on this 3 bedroom, 1 bath home. 
I^irge rooms, carpeted, storage building, combina­
tion garage and shop, and fenced back yard.

2 bedroom. 1 bath, could be three, with separate 
den and living room. Has been remodeled, with cen­
tral heat and air added. Also, a 24 x 24 garage and 
shop area.

2 bedroom, 1 bath stone home on 2‘ x lots. Ix>ts of 
pecan, fruit and oak trees. Owner will consider 
terms. $17,500.

A large 2 story with 5 bedrooms, 2 baths, den, 
separate dining and breakfast rooms, located on cor­
ner lot. Has apartment attached. A very scenic yard 
with lots of trees.

A nice 3 bedroom, 1®4 bath home on corner lot. Cen­
tral air and heat, new carpet, modern kitchen and 
built-in dishwasher. Also, a garage and storage area.

A large 3 bedroom, 1̂ 4 bath, 2 story carpeted home. 
I.arge game room and, also, a study which could be a 
4th bedroom. As a bonus, two rent houses go with pro­
perty, which are fully furnished. 2 large corner lots 
with several fruit and other trees.

FARMS & RANCHES

Near Lake Leon, a 10 acre tract of land, all in 
cultivation. $15,000, owner will finance.

62 acres near Union Center. Approx. 25 acres in 
cultivation. Good fences, '2 minerals. $800 per acre.

ISO acres South of Carbon, 60 acres in cultivation. 
Good hunting area for deer, turkey and quail. Has 
house that is good for hunters to stay in. $500 per acre.

20 acres with a large 3 bedroom, 2 bath home. Ex­
tras include; carpet, wood paneling, dishwasher, 2 
hot water heaters, built-in desk and typing table, lota 
of cabinets and closets, two car garage, bam and 
other outbuildings. There are 12 acres of coastal that 
yields 1,300 bales off two cuttings. See to appreciate. 
$75,000

435 acres northwest of Cisco. Approx. 50 acres 
cultivated land, fair to good fences. P'or the hunter, it 
has deer, turkey and quail. Some minerals. $450 per 
acre

11.19 acres with a nice 2 or 3 bedroom home, 3 car 
garage plus barn and other outbuildings. The house is 
carpeted, built-ins in kitchen and with a fireplace. 
U)ts of fruit and pecan trees A beautiful place. 
$64,000.

5 acres. A new 2 bedroom home that is carpeted, 
wood burning heater, heat pump and other extras. 
Also on property, is an old house that could be used 
for a barn. $48,000.

17*.• acres near Gorman off Desdemona highway.
Water well, 
$25,000.

natural gas available, '4 minerals.

52 acres liMated north of Eastland on Wayland 
highway. All in cultivation, four tanks, 2 water wells, 
bams & pens, and good fences. $52,000.

10 acre tracts near Gorman located on old Highway 
6. City water available $10,000.

147 acres near Carbon with approx. 80 acres 
cleared. F'air to good fences, road frontage on three 
sides and some minerals. $500 per acre with terms.

25 acres south of Eastland near fjike Leon. Kuad 
frontage, new stock tank, 20% down, owner financed. 
$35,000.

500 acres north of Eastland on highway. Kline and 
native. An older 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with 
fireplace. Barn and other outbuildings. $530 per acre.

320 acres located between Carbon and Gorman.
Some cultivation, but mostly wooded. Good fences 
and hunting, some minerals included. $500 per acre. 
Owner financed at 9% interest.

10 acres near P'astland. 120 frontage. $5000 per
acre. Terms can be arranged.

Approx. 55 acres in Ranger. Ideal location for sub­
division. Utilities available. $1500 per acre.

3‘ z acres with stock tank located approx. 1 mile 
from Eastland. $6500. Tenns can be arranged.

COM M ERt lA I.

2 acres on 120 at Olden Ramp East. Meal Iwation 
for a business. $20,000.

Approx, a 6 acre tract off highway 80 E. Ideal loca­
tion for a business. $25,000.

Valuable 120 property! Approx. 4600 sq. ft. 
Building, very versatile. Easy ac< es.sabilily. $87,500.

In Cisco! A nice brick building with 5,000 sq. ft. in 
prime downtown location $60,000.

In hlastland! A 50’ x 100 2 story building on square.- 
Ideal for retail business. $32,500.

1.3 acres joining railroad tracks with spur. 3 
buildings, one has office and bath, and a 2,000 gallon 
underground gas tank. $75,000.

In Ranger! 44 acres on Highway 80 W. 1800 sq. ft. 
office, 24,000 sq. ft. shop building, 2400 sq. ft. 
warehouse, other buildings and commercial antanna. 
Owner will consider terms. $170,000.

In Rising Star, established service station and 
garage. Located on busy highway near downtown in­
tersection. Good Income Potential. $40,000.

Uit on Interstate 20 East, approx. 4  acre located 
near Best Western. Perfect for offices or business. 
$16,000.

If you need 120 exposure for a business, we have 5 
acres on the south side. $27,000. Make offer.

Ixwated on Highway 80 E. near 120. approx. 14 
acres w ith old house and large metal garage. Now us­
ed a w recking yard. $54,000.

LEASE PROPERTY

For Lease! Commercial 6 acres in Olden. Septic 
tank and utilities available. No building

For < ommercial use only. One to five acres with 120 
frontage.

W 8 liavD  otliD r hoiN8, lo R d , an d  com m nrcial lU tin ip t. 
W 8 a p p rn c la fn  y o n r lis t in g s  an d  b n sin n ssi

O ffh lingi

K a y  B a iln y  
A ssa c la tn
•SB-23D S

P a t  M a y n a rd  
B ro k n r  

ê l f - S O é S

Jn d y  O rn isi 
A sso s la t i 

éa9-121S|

jC Ind yn  Pnstnr 
A ssa c la tn  
é S t - t i t s

In G o rm an B a ssa ll C o rd a li 
A sso c ia ta  
7 94-aé« 0

In Cisco A nn W lllia n is  
A sso c ia to  
4 4 1 -IM O

lO n t u iK JS)

Bill Griffith, Broker 
820 W est M ain-Eastland  629-1769
107 A M ain-Ranger 647-1302

Residential ío s t io n d
WE HAVE new homes under construction. Call for 

details.

TWO BEDROOM, 1 bath - has wall furnace and 
S refrigerated air condition, carport on side of house, 
 ̂ carpeted. This is only $25,000.00. E-5

NICE BRICK home on large lot, house has approx. 2400 
; sq. ft. living area. 4 BR, 2 baths, Cent. H/A, Nice buiitin 
I kitchen, custom made drapes, covered patio. Brick BQ pit 
> and smoker in back yard, nice large oak trees. You must 
' see this one. E-7

ROCK CHURCH 412 N. Bassett. Very spacious could be 
converted into residence. Already has two baths, two 
rooms that could be bedrooms. Kitchen with dining room. 
Worship hall could be huge living room. Call for details. 
E-6

NEW THREE bednv«- ' h home now under con­
struction. This is O  an exclusive area and
on a wooded lot. C w!!V.cuiils. E-9

Three bedroom, oi
close to town. This is SOLD n nice neighborhood,

_-4

NICE OLDER home situated on four lots. Two 
bedrooms, one bath. All electric kitchen, beautiful 
fireplace, big beautiful oak trees. Call for more details 
and how to get this one! F.-11

ASSUMPTION with low inte-' ^  rate: Excellent loca­
tion, close to school. Y k  'room, two bath, brick
home fenced backy, bldg in back. If you
want a nice home wit payments, check this one out. 
E-10

AT LAST! A nice horn- __ ffordablo. $36,500. 
This house ha.s 1056 s >e bedrooms, oin
bath, fenced in back y. more! E-8

DM OLDEN: Nice 3 bdrm., one bath home. 100 z  100 
foot lot. Paved street. This is really a neat place. E-16

Ranger
NICE HOME in very good location: 'This is a three 

(bedroom, two bath home. Has central heat mid air. Its 
'fully carpeted and also has a garage. Call for more infor­
mation today. R-2

THIS IS real nice one: Four bedroom, two bath, living 
room, dining room, kitchen. Completely remodeled. Has a 
huge utility room that could be made into a fifth bedroom. 
Sits on a nice large comer lot. Call now for more details. 
R-6

NICE: Three bedroom, one bath, den home. Completely 
carpeted. Back of house has an efficiency apt. Call for 

$ details. R-3

I  large

'S
SMALL three bed^i 

lot.
h fully carpeted home on

PUT YOUR FAM ILY in a home of their < wn! Start 
with this nice two bedroom, one bath home in Ranger 
Has central heat and air, red wood fence, Iî  ing rornn 
and dining i(H>m. Call now! R-4

GOOD LOCATION-Nice two bedroom, one bath home 
in THE HODGES OAK PARK ADDITION of Ranger. 
Call for more information. R-5

DM A REAL GOOD LOCATION-sits this nice two 
bedroom one bath home in Ranger, with small equity.

K Call for details. R-8

NICE-Four bedroom, one bath with one acre of land in 
Ranger, at a very low price. Has a lot of fruit trees such 
as; APPLES, PEARS, APRICOTS. Nice garden spot 
TOO! Call for more information. R-15

TIME IS A TICKDM’ DON’T  LET THIS ONE GET 
AWAY ¡-Three bedroom, one bath home. Located in the 
l.ackland addition to Ranger. Call for details. R-10

CONSIDER YOURSELF AT HOME in this coxy three 
bedroom, two bath home with living room, dining room, 
and BREAKFAST ROOM! Central heat and air. AND 
MORE! CALL FOR THE MORE! R-11

Idle Property
LAKE HOME: One bedroom, one bath, large thdag 

room overlooks lake. Bulltin kitchen, stove, dWiwaaher 
and disposal. Antenna with UHF attachment Back of M i  
slopes gently down to the lake. Call far more Informattan. 
LP-4

FOWLER REALTORS Cowitry Hemes A Acreage

Acreage
SPORTSMAN DREAM: acres in Stephen Conn-

ty. This is good land for hunting. Has 1/1 mincrali, three 
tanks and one water w ell Call now for nnore infi 
tion. A-3

INSIDE CITY LIMITS: 1.21M acres. aU cleared land. 
Great for building a new home, or putting a mobile home 
on i t  Like to know more about this? Call Now! A -li 
55 ACRES good building site. Across from new Mfh 

school in Ranger. May be subdivided or sold as a unit. A 4

FRESH ON MARKET 60 acres about 12 miles South of 
Cisco, 30 acres Coastal, 15 acres in Love Grass, rest In 
timber, 1 tank and 1 hand dug well. CaU for details. A-1

4 ACRES off old hwy. 80 E. 4  block from dty water 
main. Excellent for pipe yard or for oilfield storage. A-W

SMALL ACREAGE TO BUILD ON between 2 and $ acre 
tracts about 6 miles south of Elastland on Hwy. 6. City 
water and electricity available. Call for details. A-17

161.1 ACRES: Located NW of Ranger. This land is some 
coastal and some wooded. Four ponds sits on this land. 
Also has some corrals. CaU for more details. A4

I Kl-a*ll “ N rilF. M tK k frT ! 167 -.'MO amw. Approx- 
iiiid vlv ‘ i ■ > so. ‘ I'lMV oi> l•l.̂ :llg, Star Hwy. tla.H 
small <>!: ’ •.. . .i\< t.nik.s. pcuMii ii< ivagc, costal am!
s o m e  u- .>!• a . $.>in i a n  acre. Ihviicr will cunsuicr 
sonic (.hod. . ( '¡ « I l l  mforiiuiti« n. A-15

M ACRES NEAR LAKE-Owner financing available. 
Call for details. A-9

54 ACKES-N/W of Olden. City water available. SmaU 
tank. Call for details. A-5

16 ACRES OF ('LEARED LAND! In blue stein grass, 
fenced, with one lank, trap, and bam. CAU . TODAY! 
A-7

House with Acreage
486 ACRE RANCH: Some minerals. Executive 

with many extras! BeauUfuUy maintained! OU and 
wells on acreage. Call now for more details! HA-1

EXTRA LARGE home energy efficient, five bedrooms, 
four baths. Nimrod area on two acres. |75,000. HA-S

6 J 8  A C r S b . ^ t h  t l w a j ( k . f K m m  ^  •

fireplace and a two car gamge. t w  u in  a very good loca­
tion. HA-8

COUNTRY LIVING-Close to Eastland. Three 
bedroom, two bath home on 13 acres. MANY EXTRAS! 
Priced in the Mid Seventies Additional Acreage 
available. HA-3

Commercial A lots
ATTENTION MERCHANTS - RELOCATE! ONE half

to ONE ACRE TRACTS, aU utilities and pnve atract, 
situated in new shopping development.'Adequte parking 
space, $8,500.00. C-2 «  ,

IN CISCO, 2 large lots with many oak trees. UUlttiaa on 
property great for mobile home. L-IS

CISCO, LARGE COMMERCUL Bldg., includes nice 
size apartment, 2 bay car wash, mobU home hookup. 
Make offer. CP-6

PACKED WITH POTENTIAL Going business good In­
come, excellent location. CaU for details. CP-8

EXCELLENT BUSINESS LOCA’TKMM on Old Hwy. M 
West - has room for four office spaces, central heat and 
air, carpeted. CP-1.

s

EXCELLENT commercial property on large comer M  
- central air and heat - perfect for business officea. 
Eastland. CP-12

SMALL BUSINESS making good profit. Owners wUl 
train. Good investment for couple seeking opportunity. In 
Eastland. CP-4

EXCELLENT COMMERCUL property on W. Main 
Street in Eastland. Sits on comer lot and has adequate 
parking. CaU for details. CP-12

CISCO-Excellent property for office with plenty of park­
ing space. ISO x ISO; lot with 1500 sq. ft. building. Owner 
financing with 25% down at 11% intereat Located on a 
main thoroughfare. CP-10

EASTLANIVSm*" — ' good income. This ia an 
excellent investine ^  m  and owner financinf
at 12% interest. ’T h _ ^  «  geod buy. CP4

B Ê  G r i fm , B ro k f  
647-16S5

Wl NUD AMD APPRKIAn YOUR LISTIMGSI 
WFRt HSRt FOR YOU

Kêwàêtk Orin 4 tm . M bip
ét9>ìm647‘ 17U

Skkky Gfitm
64M 4J5
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Eostland Co. Dispatch 
Completes 6th Yeor

The Eastland County 
Cooperative Dispatch has 
now completed its sixth full 
year of operation in serving 
the Ljiw  Enforcement Agen­
cies of Eastland County.

The D ispatch which 
operates 24 hours a day is be- 
uig supported by the County 
of Eastland and the Cities of 
Cisco, Eastland, Ranger, 
Gorman and Rising Star

629-1728 is the number to 
call for EMERGENCIES re­
quiring the Police, Fire dept, 
or Ambulance service. Per­
sons outside the toll free 
area of Eastland may call 
this number COLLECT The 
number is a 24 hour a day 
number for EM ERGEN­
CIES.

With the 24 hour a day 
operation of dispatch the 
law  Enforcement Agencies 
of Eastland County can in­
crease their ability to strive 
for a low crime rate, main­
tain their programs of crime 
p reven tion , In ves tia ge  
crimes and enforce the laws.

During the calendar year 
1961 the dispatch serving the 
law  Enforcement Agencies

ToNi to us about 
35% dhriotions

Home-owners "B" 
Form & Ranch 

owners "B"

and also osk obout 
Form Equipment 

Soecid R«**s

Brockl-Form 
Coveroge on 
Commercial 
Properties

629-8533 
P.O. Bo i  392 

lo ss . Seomon 
Eostlond. TX ___
a n a n n fm n ñ í iñ fm o f

I loss
Eos1

T g w w n oe

of Eastland County, handled 
a total of 310,296 pieces of 
traffic which is as follows: 
152,466 radio transmissions,

115,693 pieces of teletype 
traffic, which include 12,894 
request for Texas vehicle 
registeration information,

8,249 request for Texas 
drivers license information,

16,619 requests for check­
ing on wanted/stolen per­
sons, vehicle and property in 
Texas.

12,027 request for checking 
on wanted/stolen persons, 
veh ic les  and property 
throughout the United 
States,

2,260 requests for out of 
state information on vehicle 
registerations and driver 
license information,

1,825 messages sent re­
questing or sending informa­
tion to other Ijiw Enforce­
ment Agencies throughout 
Texas and the United States.

Dispatch Handled 37,146 
telephone calls which m- 
elude 5,058 (13.6%) re­
questing emergency ser­
vices from the Police, Fire 
Department or ambulance 
service.

In addition to the l.aw En­
forcement Traffic handled 
the Dispatch also receives 
Weather Bulletins from the 
National Weather Service in 
Fort Worth, concerning the 
weather in the Eastland 
County Area which is 
dismitated to the l.aw En­
forcement Agencies and the 
local radio stations as soon 
as possible after being 
received.

The Dispatchers presently 
employes at dispatch are do­
ing an excellent job in handl­
ing the traffic load and 
should be commended for 
the way the dispatch is 
operating and their ability to 
handle emergency situations 
that arise.

Lodies Interested 
In Gome Day To 
Attend Meeting

All ladies interested in 
game day at the Lone Cedar 
Country Club, please come 
to a called business meeting 
Thursday, Feb. 18 at 2:00 
p.m. at the club.

NBC
NEWS/MUSIC

FM97
RADIOS 24 HOURS

r Dorothy’» Sup»binc 
Fahric»

1108 Avenue D, Cisco 
442-1782 10 a.m. - 5 p.m

W* carry a (ull-lin* of fabrics and sewing notions 
Coats and Clark Red Heart Yarn also ovailable

P-9ltc

f > TC

Bookkeeping and Tax Service
r

Ken Parrack
205 Eost Moin Ranger 647 3032 

116 North Seomon Eostland 629.8641

INCOME TAX RETURNS 
MONTHLY AND QUARTERLY

REPORTING FOR BUSINESS
Indtvlckiol, Portriership. ond Corporation Tow Returns
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County Teochers 
Federal Credit 
Union To Meet

The Eastland County 
Teachers Federal Credit 
Union will hold their annual 
meeting Monday, February 
22, 1982, at 7:00 p.m. at the 
Community Room of the 
First National Bank in Cisco. 
All members are urged to at­
tend.

BEN KARNES

Music Study Club 
To Host Second 
Concert In Series

The Music Study Club will 
hosts its 2nd concert in the 
Friends of Music series to 
day. Wed. at 3:00 p.m. at the 
Women’s Club.

The program  w ill be 
G ilb ert and S u llivan ’ s 
H.M.S. Pinafore performed 
by D allas pianist Ben 
Karnes

Anyone still wishing to join 
Friends of Music may do so 
by paying $3.00 at the door.

Reagon Brown 
To Be Speaker 
At Leon-Bosque

Reagan V. Brown, Texas 
Com m issoiner of
Agricultural, will be the 
featured speaker at the an­
nual meeting and banquet of 
the l..eon-Bosque Resources 
Conservation and Develop­
ment Area (RC&D).

The meeting will be held 
March 17,1982 at the Proctor 
Area Recreation Center on 
l,ake Proctor in Comanche 
Councty.

The Leon-Bosque Area 
covers Bosque, Comanche, 
Eastland , E rath  and 
Somervell Counties.

The public is invited to at­
tend. Tickets can be pur­
chased at the local soil con­
servation service offices in 
the various counties.

Foreign Missions 
Film To Be Shown 
At Area Church
A foreign missions film 

Moved With Compassion”  
will be shown at 7.30 p.m. 
Wednesday at the Greater 
Mountain Top Pentecostal 
Church. The public is invited 
to view this outstanding mis­
sions film. It is not just 
another film. It is the song of 
India, sung with a different 
refrain. It is an experience of 
agony and ecstasy not soon 
to be forgotten.

From the moment of entry 
through the gateway at 
Delhi, you will be awed by 
the magnificent architec­
tural wonders and touched 
by the masses as you walk 
through the streets of Bom­
bay and Calcutta. You will 
enter the forbidden inner 
courts of Hindu worship and 
drift down the Gangi River 
to behold sights unseen by 
most people. You will be 
thrilled by the worship of 
Christian believers who are 
"spirit-filled”  as they wor­
ship and rejoice m con­
ference with Adur You will 
be "moved with compas­
sion”  as you view this film.

The public is invited to at­
tend this film and witness In­
dian as seldom seen. The 
film will start at 7:30 p.m. 
The church is located just 
ten miles south of Cisco on 
Highway 183 in Romney- 
Community, on the highway.

SHOP EASTLAND 
COUNTY FIRST

t .1
N e w

A r r i v a l s

Joseph Lynn Liles
Glenn and Kathy Liles of 

Granbury are proud to an­
nounce the birth of their son 
Joseph Lynn Liles, born 
January 26, Johnson County 
M em oria l H osp ita l in 
Cleburne. The new arrival 
weighed 8 lbs. 12 oz at birth 
and was 21 inches long.

The baby’s grandparent’s 
are Mr. and Mrs. Kirby 
Fears of Stephenville and 
Mr. and Mrs. J.W. Liles of 
Granbury.

Great-grandparents to the 
new arrival are Mr. and R.O. 
Fears of Azle, Mr. and Mrs. 
O H. Robinson of Van and 
Etta Liles of Fort Worth.

E.L.
Graham 
Hospital

I yUfting Hours: 2:00- 
r 4:00 & 7:00-9:00 ri

Patien ts  in the E .L . 
Graham Memorial Hospital 
were listed as follows; 

Clarence Wilcoxen 
Lillian Brueggeman 
Ethel Speed 
Daisy Steel 
Estes Agnew 
Olga Jacob 
Mamie Forehand 
Ella Hasty 
Sheron Cook 
Lora Ford 
Albert Sander 
Donna Williams 
James Smedley.

Former Secretory 
Of State To 
Speok In Abilene

George W. Strake, former 
Secretary of the State of 
Texas, will be speaking at a 
luncheon. It will be held in 
Abilene at the Red Lobster 
Restaurant at 11:45 on Mon­
day, Feb. 22nd.

Mr. Strake has asked that 
an invitation be extended to 
any interested residents of 
Eastland county. Those who 
wish to attend or would like 
further information, please 
call Peg Morris at 629-8345.

r EASTLAND TELEGRAM  
Eastland, Texas

RANGER TLMES 
Ranger, Texas

Thursday, February 18, 1982

CISCO PRESS 
Cisco, Texas
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What you don’t know 
about nutrition 
probably shows 

on your waistline.
When you decide to lose weight, call Diet 
Center. Our program works and it’s totally 
natural You will lose weight quickly and safely, 
without hunger, nervousness or loss of energy 

but what’s even more impxsrtant, you’ll learn 
how to keep it off! You’ll learn how your body 
functions and what it needs to operate at [>eak 
efficiency. You ’ll met daily with a counselor 
who cares and understands. She knows what it 
takes to lose weight and keep it off because she 
has done it herself!

LOS€17'IOQ5 POUriDS
IMJUST6W€€kS!...

And, if necessary, that rate of reduction can be 
sustained until you have lost 50, 75 or even 100 
pounds and more! Join the thousands of men, 
women and children who are losing over one 
million pounds each month at Diet Center. 
You ’ll be surprised at how satisfying a 
nutritionally balanced diet can be. Call today 
for a free, introductory consultation It could 
change your life'

Join the thousands of men, women and 
children who are losing over one million 

pounds each month at 1,400 
Diet Center locations across 

the United States and 
Canada

“The Natural IVay to Lose IVeig/if"
NO SHOTS • NO DRUGS 

NO PREPACKAGED FOODS 
NO CONTRACTS

Mary CRfton
2012 W. Commerce, Eastland

T 14 629-8361 7:30-4:30

BOB TURNER SEES 
COMPANY

ROUTE 1 BRECXENRIOOE, TEXAS (817)889-8008

S0R6UM SUDAN 3-WAY CROSS 
KICINORASS 75 
NATIVE GRASS SEED 
ALL OTHER TYPES PIEIO SEED

Rongar 
General 
Hospitol

Vitking Hovn 2: 
F 4 :0 0  4 6KI04:30
Patients In Ranger General
Hospital
Myrtle Gilbert
Lela McGough
Veta O’Steen
Tellie Shankle
Pinkney Bradley
A.D. Wynn
Raymond Sandefur
Claude Strong
I.E. Maupin
George Moore
Lilan Tucker
Florence Yancey
Pete Bibby
Nina Hopkins
Ardeth Copeland
Wanda Tackett
Frances Alverson
Alice Blackman
Raymond Hughes

Eostland 
Memoriol

Hospital
VisHing Hours: 2:30-/ 

1̂  4:00 & 7:00-8:30
Patients in the Eastland 

Memorial Hospital were 
listed as follows:
Sue Pierce 
Helen Britt 
Danna Jarvis 
Nancy Hughes 
Tesha Linn 
Ruby Carter 
Barbara Jackson 
Viola V. Spargo 
Rosie B. Parker 
Ixinnie Pennington 
Loie Walton 
Mattie McPherson 
Joyce Elmore 
Doris Gwinn 
Peggy L. Bullock 
Barbara JoAnn Johnson 
Irene M. Denton 
Hazel Day 
Charles W. Standi 
Marian Herridge 
Merle Garrett 
Edna Williams 
Kenny Hudson 
Lisa Thackerson 
Tiffany Guise 
James Mason 
Laura Bennie 
Eva Kelley 
George Prestridge 
Carl Weiser 
Harmon Weston 
Byron B. Wheat 
William Alexander 
Manon Cox 
Katherine Wolf 
O.B. Poyner 
Ruth Herring 
Richard Dodrill 
Clyde Grissom 
Dorothy Await 
Lena Weatherby 
Mozelle Terry

AN Repoirs
Jim Caldwell

Motors
314 W. Main Eastland

Donna Clark 
Jim Patton 
R.V, Lewis 
Barbara Rossander 
Tracy Maddox 
l.enorah Alford 
Teresa Beasley 
Emily Culverhouse 
Gilbert Gaeta 
Turner Alexander 
Avery Holt

Charles Brooks 
Mary Harden 
Eula Wright 
Mattie Owens 
Helen Basham 
Aubrey Collier 
Pearl Keeney 
Rhonda Huckaby 
Muri Hagemann 
Ethel Teague 
Deborah Estes

Jim Caldwell 
Motors

is offering

A Front End Alignment 
Special

*17”
for most American cars

(Soma axcaptions)

At
Jim Caldwell Motors You Will Find

2 Fully QUAILIFIED 
Mechanics to handle 

ALL

.Complete Transmission Work

.Front End Alignment .Tune-ups 
.Ah’ Conditioner Work .Repairs of all Types

Car Spotlight
New 1981■
Phoenix

$7855“
LIST PRICE <9026**

lOADED

Your GM Dealer
CADIUAC BUICK PONTIAC 

OLDSMOBILE CMC Trucks

aldwell
817 629-2636 

314 W. Moin St„

otors
Eostland, Texos

M O ’S SPORTS
^  308 E. MAIN

EASTLAND, TEXAS 76448 
PHONE (817) 629-8601a

25%  OFF SALE
Walls Coots Reg. price ^58 & up 
Jerry Coots Reg price ^70 & up 

Court Cosal Warm up Reg. price S4() & up 
Ranger Athletic Warm up 
Youth Reg. price »31«
Adult Reg. price »32*»

AdMas Worm up svftt Reg. »106*» & up 
Cal Sport Worm up 4 ^  g „p 

Your Advantoge Shirts P»g. 4*^
Dallas Cowboy Frisboo Reg. $300

^OosoJ3u1JnJh(W

Nike Eliminator 
Nike Cascode 

Adidas Squire 
Adidos Lisa 

SpetbRt Softbal Shoes Reg. ^37*^
Brooks Reg. ^25** 

Pumo Roiidmoster Reg.

Reg $26’ * 
Reg. $25H  

Reg $ 2 8 "  
Reg. *24**

Fi)

M 5
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BUY, JCLL, TRADE OH RENT THROUGH THE

Thursday, February 18, 1982

Wanted
jRANCKR TIMES 
I Ran|{t‘r, Texas

WANTED: A full time cook's 
helper. New pay scale. App­
ly in person to Northview 
Development Center. 401 W. 
Moss. T-16

HOMEMAKERS NEEDEID 
Part time. Minmium wanes 
Contact Girling Health Care 
Center. 915-643-5525 T-17

W,VNT TO BUY: Used fur­
niture S&K Sales, 515 E. 
Mam, Eastland. Call 629-8382 
or 629-2241. TC

W AN TE D : Fu ll tim e 
pumper in Ea.stland County 
area. Dependability and ex­
perience required. Salary 
and benefits negotiable, bas­
ed upon qualifications. 
P lease inquire to 4127 
Saranac. Dallas, Texas 75220 
or (214 ) 350-2562 after 6:00 
p.m. T-16

SHOP Foreman needed at 
Hood King Motor Company. 
Apply in person. T-17

LVN's have you tried a 
personal rewarding joy 
as a charge nurse in a 
nursing home. Cisco 
Nursing Center has 
openings for full time 
and part time I.VN’s on 
all shifts. Call 442-1471, 
director of nurses Don­
na Campbell, or P.O. 
Box 190, 1401 Front 
Street, Cisco. p-94tfc

For sale

FOR sale :: ‘Antique 
Glass and E'urniture’ 
and other collectibles. 
‘We Buy Estates.’ The 
House of Antiques mov­
ed to 908 So. Bassett, 
E:astland, Texas open 
everyday. T-F

FOR SALE
Beautiful 3 bedrooms, 2 
full baths, fireplace. 
Buy now and choose 
your decor. Priced  
below appraisal.

BIG COUNTRY 
REAL ESTATE 

442-1693, Cisco or after 6 
p.m. 442-3958, Cisco, p-7

AUI0$
For Sale;

1974 I.TD Station Wagon 
with 4 seats, automatic, 
air conditioner, tape 
player. Priced to sell, 
$650.00. 458 Pine or call 
647-3415. T-18

FOR SALE: ‘80 Ford, ton, 
300, power, air, 4 speed. 
28,000 miles. Call 442-1709, 
Cisco. p-5tfc

E'OR SALE: 1978 Camero 
a/c AM-FM cassette, good 
tires 47,000 actual miles, 
good condition $3795.00. 7 to 5 
call 629-1352, after 5 call 
653-2332. T-14

FOR SALE: 78 Chevrolet 
Dooley, one ton, power, air, 4 
speed, S ilverado, 60,000 
miles. 817-442-2304. p-14

EASTLAND itLEt.RAM 
Easlland, Texas

For ecni
FOR RENT; Furnished 
or unfurnished apart­
ments, Roya l Oak 
Apartments, 1304 Royal 
Lane, C isco. Call 
442-3232. T-C

be:a l t i f l l  n e w  a p a r t ­
m e n t s  FOR RENT: Two, 
clean one-bedroom apart­
ments available immediate­
ly Double in.sulated win­
dows, fu lly  insulated 
throughout. Dishwasher, 
disposal, electric range. Ful­
ly carpeted. Individual 
washer and dryer hookups. 
Wire for telephone and 
television cable in each 
room. Fully draped. Ideally 
located. Water, sewer, trash 
and TV cable paid. Call 
629-1010. TNF

GARAGE SALES

GARAGE SAI.E: Friday,
Feb. 19. 518 East Conner in .
Eastland. Bar stools, wed- |
ding dress, formals, king .
size mattress, Avon, dishes, |
clothes and misc. p-14 |

CLSCO PRESSJ’ 
Cisco, Tex.is ^

NBC
NEWS/MUSIC

FM97
RADIO ̂ 24  HOURS

Mary Koy Cosmetics
For o privat«, 
r«ord«r coH

Transmission Work
Jim Caldwell

Motors
314 W Main Eastland

“ HOME SATELLITE TV 
SYSTEM You can build or 
buy. Sixty channels enter­
tainment! Free details. 
Satellite, Box M2, Arcadia, 
Ok. 73007.”  T-15

REDUCE SAFE & fast with 
GoBese Tablets or capsules 
& E-Vap water pills” . Cen­
tral Drug. T-17

--------------------------- ^

See M.H. Perry for
HOSPITAIJZATION 

INSURANCE 
629-1Ó66 or 629-1095 ,

rrtf'y

Now ovailabl« in Ci*co. 
complimontary facial ar

VIRGIE GREGG
PROFESSIONAL BEAUH CONSULTANT 

442-3460

YOU NEED A TV CABLE C ^ K T IO N  
for complete television enjoyment 

★  ★  ★
^Southern Television Systems Corpi

Serving Cisco, Eostfcmd, Ronger 
Coll us for complete mfurmotion

Adult Idueation Classes
ATTENTION: ADULT LEARNERS INVEST IN YOUR FUTURE.

Free adult education classes are now in piogress. These 
classes will enable a person to earn their G.E.O. Certificate 
(high school equivalencyl.

Enrollment is continuous. Room 102 Eestland High School. 
Time 6:00 to 8:30 P .M . Mondajf and Thursday.

FRED'S lie»«' !
C A I CAIIF CENTER

1-20 & Hwy 206 West
442-4411 

Transmission 
Special $22^ 5

Plus Tax
(filter & 4 qts. fluid)

Tune-up Auto Repair 
Tires Batteries

Ppen 7A.M. to 7P.M. Except Thursdo

MACK FARQUHAR
MANAGER

FOR SAI.E: l¿trgc Commer­
cial Building on Ave. I) in 
Cisco. SOxIlX) feel. F'ront of­
fice. Itesl nKJiiLs, elear-span 
back. Two large back doors 
lone on alley, one on slabl. 
Ideal Commernal, Oil FTeld 
K e la led , Warehou.sing. 
R eta il Center. W rite 
Building. I'.O. Box 29, 
F.a.stland, Texas 76448, or 
call 629-1707 or 629-2413 Tf

.SAVE ON FKF.l): I ’canul 
hay pellets only $2.75 per 50 
pound ba.se, Al.so available in 
bulk Gorman Milliiu; ('o. 
Gorman, Texas H17-734-'-!'252. 
■|'-27

FOR SALE: 1 - I.illislon 
Rollins Cultivator with Row 
Markers. 1 - 2 Row KMC 
Peanut Inverter. 1 - 2 Row 
I/ing Peanut Digger. 1 - 2 
Row Dearborne Cultivator. 1 
- 3 bottom flip over John 
Deere mouldboard. Call 
629-2058 after 6:00 p.m. T-14

COSTAL SPRIGS for sale. 
Willie Cantwell, Jr. 647-1962 
or Marvin Jones 445-3501. 
T-20

HAY FOR SALE 
'2000 bales of heavily fer­
tilized and irrigated 
H aygrazer. Highest 
quality. $2.85 a bale. 
Can d e liv e r . Call 
647-3264 or 647-1634. T-15

For Sale:
Side by side gold 
ref rigera  tor/freezer.
Ice maker, frost free, 
guaranteed. Original 
price $1.100 for $350.00.
458 Pine Ranger 647-3415 
Have pair of clothesline 
 ̂poles. T-18

FOR SALE: 1981 Ford 
F150 Ranger supercab,, 
30M. 4-speed overdrive, 
power and air. See at 
1107 West 15th, Cisco, or 
rail 817-442-1912. p-3tfc

WE C A R E  ABOUT 
YOUR HEALTH 

S p ec ia liz in g  in 
physical a ilm ents 
related to the spine and 
nervous system.

Dr. Geo. G. McPaul 
Chiropractor 

Telephone 647-3821 
454 Pine Street Ranger 

Please Gip & Save > 
TC

♦  *

Î  WOULD LIKE to sew «  
«  lor public. 629-1971 or J 
J 629-1049. Ask for Sue. {

:  Î

lYERLA ELECTRICAL 
Residential Commercial 

Appliance Repair
Phon« A h «r 6 p.m .

 ̂ . 629 1448 t 77 I

i

For That New 
FORD car or 

FORD truck or 
POLLED HEREFORD 
bull. See Jr. Chambers, 
8-5, 817-442-1566 or 
817-259-3453, nights, p-18

Tune Ups
Jim Caldwell

Motors
314 W. Main Eastland

1st STATE BANK of Rising 
Star is now accepting bids on 
vehicles thru Feb. 18, 1982. 
Vehicles are located on bank 
lot.

1978 GMC Jimmy 4-W Dr. 
High Sierra;

1976 Buick;
1964 Razorback 14 ft. boat 

and 45 HP motor with 
trailer;

1971 Terrill House trailer 
14’ X 70’ . 6-2tc

RATING! ̂ 3
CAKE DECORATING} 

DONE
Decorated Cakes for 

birthdays onniversories and 
weddings. Also bread, dinner 

rolls, brownies, cookies, 
cinnamon rolls and pies. 

^Everything Is HOMEMADE..
liver to yourhomej 

oHice. Coll 639-2505
T 16

CISCO R A D IA T O R  
SERVICE 

207 E. 6th Street 
(Breckenridge Hwy) 

Cisco, Texas 
C lean ln g-rod d in g- 

recoring-auto-truck- 
tra c to r rad ia tors- 
heaters. New radiator 
and heaters. Auto gas 
tanks cleaned-repaired. 
Open Monday thru Fri­
day, 8 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. 
Call 442-1547,
else«.____________ p-5tf(;

w  w  w-w  ^  ^  ^  ^

j??LEGAL PROBLEMS??!
Divorce from *49** 

Bankruptcy from *300** 
Simple Wills from *25**

fifing fees not included
Saturday & Sunday appointments 

available.
: Our temporary Office will 

be in your urea soon.
Full Legal Services available, 

including oil & gos lenses, title 
opinions, etc. doll suits 

& criminal actions
Terms Available

Willow Park Legal Clinic 
Weatherford, Texas 

(817) 441-7551 
Call 8-6 for appointment

M O N U M E N T S

LOYAL & DORIS 
CURBING 

U ST DATES 
70S E Sill

WORKS
LUNDSTROM OWNER

442-9995
CISCO.TEX.

HARGRAVE INSURANCE 

AGENCY
nSSAve.D  
C i s c o ,  Tex

Personoi Soles A Service For 
NOME Insurance

— Cer Insurance
— Commerciol Susinets Insurance 

Mobile Home Insurance A Trmvel Trnflers
~ Boot Insurance 
^ LHe Insurance 

Bonds Of All Kinds
Shirley A. Hargrove 

442-1477 Or 442-1059

Tucker Auction Con\pany
Monthly Consignment Soles 

First Saturday of Each Month 
MERCHANDISE CONSIGNMENTS ACCEPTED

Estate, Farm, and Liquidation Sales Also Conducteo 
Contoct FRED TUCKER-Licensed Auctioneer 7:00 p.m. 
(TxS082-1152) At (817)629-1956 Approximotely 

mile oH FM2563 in FLATWCX)D COMMUNITY jc

Puzzled ? BIG COUNTRY RFAL F.SI ATK
m

RAR Carpet
Cleaning

Randall Rogers, Owner
FOR FREE ESTIMATE

Call 629-1121

!..

Over 5 years 
service in this ^

509 E. 8t.h 
Cisco, Texas 76437

TRY 55...
AND MAYBE YOU WON'T BE.

Some dtiverf era i i h i  putgipe over the Nettersei 
SS MPH speed limit A reeersi eurvey enowt met 
neeriy FS per cent of the drivers le y  ihey «rent 
to keep S5 b eeeuie they know M SA V ES LIVES 
end coneerves tue* Bui meny driver» eiiM e> 
eeed tne limn at- oceeeion 
Speed incree»e» the severity ot tniuriee when e 
ereen eccure end often eeueee tene<on Be 
• low down re ie i end EN JO Y TEXAS

(• me»»«e* 'rem |M» ne«»pep«r »ne the Treoeor» et 
the Tei«» onSi

72 Chev. »30- WK
72 Ford »30“  WK
73 Ford *30* WK 
73 Pontiac »35- WK 
73 Bukk »35- WK 
67 Fiat »30- WK

Open 9:00 a.m, 
to 8:00 p.m.

7 Days A Week

301 W. BUY 5FIL OR TRADE

3 G Prix »35- WK
75 Bukk »35- WK
76 Buick »35- WK 
71 Bukk *30- WK 
78 Ford Pkk Up
77 Pontiac »35- WK

Eastland
Commerce We Finance 817-629-876

So siys till VA. HUNT
M im  iMit

O M  SAV» 
BV

OOveAA-’VBAJT
iikSuKAwC* 

PK£MIUA<S

' Sf/V' -AmnuA U > 
OK A nm ualcV

Cantaci naaitii VA stiict 
(cnttk ya«r pWnt kotk) tr 

a ecal « te ta n i grau.

DANAGOOSEN Brokir 
(8 1 7 )4 4 2  3 'i6 fl

HOMES
Brick, 3 BD, 2 Bath, builder is finishing up, buy now and pick the carpet, tile and tops. 
One lot or two. Cent H/A, large corner lot. Nice spot.
Lovely corner lot, fenced, carport, 2 BD older home.
Cozy home near intermediate school, carport, *16,500.
3BD, fenced, garden, nice for pets and kids corner lot *23,500.
Rock and cedar, 4 BD, corner lot, nicely remodeled, carport.
Spacious 4 BD, 3 full baths, family room, formal living & dining room, attic fan. 
Central H A, approx 2600 sq. ft.
Large rooms, needs slight face lift, 2 BD. nice lots.
ONLY *8,000.00 frome home on East 6th St. Some furniture. Owner carry.
RISING STAR- 3 BD on '/* acre, fenced, large rooms & storage

LAKE CISCO PROPERTY
We have two 1 BD cabins, on good lots, both owner carry.
Secluded deepwater cove, 3 BD, firepi. Cent H/A, nice.
2 BD, 2 lots, nice patio and porch, lovely lake home.

A CREAGE
20 acres in coastal with 2 BD minii-form, nice SW Cisco.
400 acres or 42 ocs. 1/8 minerals ovailable, large 3 BD, brick firepi, sprinklers, 
hands quarters, barns, shop.
640 acres N. Cisco • No minerals 
BUILD your own home • 1 & 2 acre sites East Cisco.

COMMERCIAL
Vi City block just west of Ave. D at 15th.
Corner lot and office building, parking, good income.
Fast food business, good income for rioht party.

EASTLAND
4plex, 1 BD units, nets good income.

S 24,000 sq. ft. warehouse with front offices, 96,000 sq. ft. parking.
Near RR and close to town

OFFICE (817) 442-169.3
OFFICE HOURS 9-12 1-5 « SATURDAYS, SUNDAYS & EVENINGS CALL 
Rosemary 442-4226 • Dana 442-3958 •  Penny 442-1707

SMWWffl
• uana •



A TH RILL THAT is a rare 
experience for golfers was 
exp er ien ced  by T rbcy  
Owens, CJC freshman, the 
other afternoon. He scored a 
hole>in-one!

Tracy’s ace came on the 
140-yard No. 2 hole at the 
Cisco Country Club. Playing 
with Ernie and Bonnie Rice 
of Eastland, members of the 
Cisco Country Club, Tracy 
hit a seven-iron into a pretty 
stiff wind. His ball hit in 
front of the green and disap­
peared.

When the three golfers got 
to the green, they looked 
around for a time without 
seeing the ball. Finally, they 
looked in the cup and found 
Tracy’s ball

The CCC P ro  Shop, 
operated by John and L e t^  
Schaal, took Tracy's ball to 
have a trophy made for hun. 
The Pro Shop now provides a 
trophy for all golfers who 
shoot holes-in-one. Tracy is 
the son of the George 
Owenses and has been play- 
,ng golf at the CCC since he 
was big enough to swing a 
golf club He IS one of the 
club's top players.

Servic«t For 
Welbort Shelton 
Held Mondoy

Graveside services for 
Welbert (Bit) Shelton. 59. of 
Cisco, were at 3 p.m. Mon­
day at Oakwood Cemetery, 
d irected by Kimbrough 
Funeral Home. The Rev 
Buddy Sipe of First Baptist 
Church officiated 

Mr. Shelton died Saturday 
aftenioon at his home 

He was bom March 29, 
1922, in Clarksville He Uved 
in Cisco most of his life. He 
was a World War II Army 
Air Corps veteran He was a 
former postal employee and 
a laborer.

S u rv ivo rs  include a 
brother, Howard J. of Cisco; 
and a number of nieces and 
nephews.

ANOTHER CJC student. 
Kory Wallace, is a substitute 
mother to an orphan calf 
these days. During a recent 
icy spell, Kory went out to 
the family ranch Just west of 
town early one morning to 
check on his club cow -  an 
Aberdeen-Angus. And a 
baby calf had arrived.

Next morning, Kory went 
out again and found that the 
mother had died and that the 
calf appeared about dead 
from the cold weather and 
starvation. He loaded the 
calf into the pickup truck 
and took it home -  to College 
Hill, where his parents, the 
Dr. Norman Wallaces, live.

The Wallace family got 
busy. The calf was given 
warm milk and a warm 
place to stay. Within hours, 
the calf was showing im­
provement. And in a few 
days, the calf was spry and 
fnsky, drinking milk and 
eating pellets of grain.

Now, the calf comes to the 
back door of the Wallace 
home when he is hungry. He 
enjoys frolicking in the yard 
with Kory and seems to con­
sider himself a member of 
the family. Before long, he’ll 
be ready to go back to the 
pasture as a healthy bull 
calf.

DROPPED IN AT the B&J 
Restaurant, the former Spot 
Restaurant, the other day 
and found that business is 
good and p ick ing up. 
They ’ ve done a lot of 
overhau ling and
redecorating, including a 
new floor. And the B&J 
stands for Bonnie and John 
Moss, the new owners.

The menu at the B&J in­
cludes a Senior Citizen 
special with a choice of 
meats, two vegetab les, 
salad, desert and drink. 
First folks to order the 
Senior Cituen Special were 
Mr. and Mrs E.F. Bender, 
who are long-time Ciscoans 
and who are S4 and 80 years 
old. respectively.

Mr. Moss opened and 
operated a garage for 
several years after they 
moved here. He closed the 
garage because of a health 
problem and is now helpuig

Mrs. Moss, who is experienc­
ed in restaurant operations. 
Their daughter and husband 
are also active in the 
business.

SAN ANTONIO was the 
site of the biggest music con­
vention ever held in Texas 
last week and a number of 
Ciscoans and former Cis­
coans took part in the event. 
It was the combined conven­
tions of the Texas Music 
Education Association and 
the Music Educators Na­
tional Conference.

Mayor Eris Ritchie, whose 
Southwest Enterprises does 
big business in the music 
field, was there with a booth. 
AnKMig those he saw were 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Jeffcoat 
of Intermediate School, Tim 
Jones of CJC, Al Young of 
(THS and Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Zellman, all of Cisco. Mrs. 
Zellman is band director at 
Rising Star, and because all 
hotels were full, Mr. GZ took 
theu- travel trailer there for 
her to use during the 
meeting.

Former Ciscoans greeted 
by Mayor Ritchie included 
Dr. Jack Chambless of New 
Mexico SUte University. 
Las Cruces, N.M.; Bob Mad­
dox, Odessa; and Lynn Low 
and wife, Waco. Matt Rit­
chie, CHS Junior, went to San 
Antonio on the bus late in the 
week to help his dad with 
work at the booth.

The program was super, 
reports the mayor. It includ­
ed performances by the all- 
state band and choir.

A TRAVEL Trailer outing 
of a month or so was enjoyed 
recently by Mr. and Mrs. 
Audy Moore of 1204 West 
14th Street. They made the 
trip in company with two 
couples from Cross Plains. 
Mr. Moore is a retired 
Church of Christ minister. . .  
JP Carlton Holder went to 
Stanton Tuesday to attend 
funeral services for an un­
cle, Mr. John Pinkston, 85, 
who died there Sunday. Mrs. 
Pinkston ’ s sister, Mrs. 
Trudy Andrews of Cisco, was 
unable to make the trip . . . 
Hear that Steve Wheeler, 
CJC prof., is opening a shop 
to repair computers as a 
spare time hobby.

SEE BY THE papers that 
sales tax money for last 
month amounted to $31,091 
for the City of Cisco. This

WTU To Increase 
Rotes To Customers

A settlement agreement 
a llow in g  West Texas 
Utilities Company to in­
crease Its rates to retail 
customers has been approv­
ed by the Texas Public 
L ib rary Commission of 
Texas.

compared with $26,202 for 
the same month last year. 
Other area cities and their 
January checks included 
Eastland, $36,493; Putnam, 
$2,087; Moran, $1,168; Rising 
Star, $2,805; and Ranger, 
$16,801 . . .  Barbara Wylie of 
Cisco was the winner of a 
“ name that tune’ ’ contest of 
FM Radio 97, Eastland, 
recently.

The new rates, which will 
average about 8.3 per cent 
above the old rates, were 
placed in effect on Friday, 
February 12. This action is in 
accordance with a stipulated 
agreem ent with all in­
terveners, including cities 
represent^ by the Texas 
Municipal League, WTU and 
the PUC sUff.

'The increase is designed to 
increase the Company’s an­
nual retail revenues by $11.8 
million. A wholesale rate in­
crease of $5.5 million, also 
settled by agreement and ex­
pected to be approved by the 
Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission in Washington, 
would bring WTU’s total an­
nual revenue increase to

Carole's Cafe
808 E. 8th Street

Open 6:30 AM to 7 PM 
Breakfast

Lunch
Dinner

Salad Bar

$17.3 million. The company 
had applied for a total In­
crease of $32.2.

The effect on a residential 
bill for 600 kilowatt-hours of 
electricity per month would 
be slightly over 10 per cent. 
This would include the fuel 
cost adjustment. For 600 
kilowatts at a residence, the 
bill would be $37.89 under the 
new rates and $34.39 under 
the old rates.

Truck Lood (H 
Concrete Pipe 
In Mishap Here

A driver sustained minor 
injuries and his truck over­
turned with a cargo of heavy 
pipe on IH-20 southeast of 
Cisco around 2 a.m. Satur­
day, Feb. 13.

The driver, Ronald A. 
Cash, 44, of Grand Prairie, 
was treated at Eastland 
Memorial Hospital. He had

cuts and bruises and was 
released later in the day.

DPS Trooper Steve Tone, 
who in ves tiga ted  the 
m ishap, reported  that 
Driver C ^  was going west 
with a truck carrying a load 
of concrete pipe to Lubbock. 
The truck had started to pass 
a car and overturned when 
the car being passed veered 
into the left lane, the report 
said.

The truck came to rest up­
side down in the median area 
between the east and west 
paved traffic lanes. The 
huge pipe Joints, each 
w eigh in g about 16,000 
pounds, were still on the 
ground between the highway 
lanes Monday afternoon, 
awaiting a truck and loading 
equipment.

The mishap occurred on 
IH-20 south of the Colony 
Restaurant. A Mangum Ser­
vice Center wrecker from 
Eastland picked up the 
truck, which had extensive 
damage.

Natica Of Moating 
Of Osco Hesoital 
DIftriet't Board 

Of Mractort
The regu la r monthly 

m eeting o f the Cisco 
Hospital District’s Board of 
Directors will be at 7:30 p.m. 
Monday, February 22, in the 
E .L. Graham Mem orial 
H osp ita l’ s Con ference 
Room.
ORDER OF BUSINESS:

1. Meeting called to order.
2. Approval of minutes of 

previous meeting.
3. Report of Chief of Staff.
4. Report of administator.
5. Unfinished business.
6. New business.
7. Executive session.
8. Adjournment.

Ervin E. Addy, Jr., M.D. 
President of 
Governing Board

Thursday,
Fobruary 18, 1982

r  Happy 39th Birthday | 
I Luke I
j__ From Your C r e w ________J

YtSTERYtAR LOG HOMES
Build your own energy efficient 

log home or we will construct on 
your lot. Beoutiful, mointenonce 

free and 2/3 the cost of 
conventionol homes to build. 

442-4777. .

Marvallee's 
Dress Shop
B ll E. Bth CiscoTops - Tops - Tops

Half price TOPS SALE
Good selection in all sizes 6 to +6

L y c ra  Stretch Jeans
J r . i  M iss is  R eg . *31®®

B ra x te n

S I  795
Jeans S 1 2 9 5

E m b ro ld B ryPocket J e a n s S  ^  C S S

Pants ^
$B4SS ize  B-ZÜ Size  3Z-4B

I Coca-Cola
titar«

Coco-Cola
32 oz. 6 poch

r. Pepped  
Pops!

32 oz.òpcMii

Buy 1 get 1 FREE

Morton's

Anniversary SALE
Wednesday February 17 - Sunday Fobruary 21

Quick Way
Gro. - Deli • Bakery

Com Kits
Monlton

Zetta 16 Oz.

Saltinos

V

Chips
ll.g .99 '

Kraft Longhorn

Choose
10 oz.

Diet Rite
Colo

6  pock 12 oz. cons

Moodow Lo kr
toftmorg. 16 oz.

Soft& Protty
itto rt. toBot tbsuo 

2 ply 4 rol

/ \
Foremost

Gd. Homo

19

Loy't
Potato Chip

R e g . ‘ V

Docker
Bacon

12  oz.

Herby'i 8oz.

Pimento
Choose

Florida Gold

Orange Juice
frozen 6oz.

Kraft Ametkon 

1 2 oz.tlicod

Om phoirt

Tomato Soup

Bananas

r O V A T O-cnirs- » O I F *

Bounty
Towels

u .

Open 24 Hours 1104 W. 8th

FRESH FROM OUR BAKERY
French Brood CQ« Powdered Sugar 

Poonut Butter Cookies

Cora Dogs 3/^1®®
DELI SPECIALS
Chopped

BBQ Sandwiches 9 9 c
Dozen Htllshire

■Apart Broad Loaf
Gorman Sausage ^ 2^ ,

Breasted Chicken
Eight Piece Family Pock 
With Pototoes and Rolls

$399
Per Lb. Burritos 3/^1®®


