
Family Rim Seríes To Be 
Shown At High School

A new film series featur* 
ing family expert James C. 
Dobson, Ph.D., will be shown 
at Uw Cisco High School 
Auditorium on every Tues- 
day, September 15 through 
October 27 at 7:00 p.m. En- 
titl(^ “Focus on the Fami­
ly, ” the series presents 
seven of Dobson’s most 
popular presentations, all of 
which were filmed at family 
life seminars. Titles of the 
films and dates to be shown 
are:

“ The S trong-W illed 
Child”^September 15

“Shaping the Will Without 
B reak ing  the

Spirif’-September 22 
" C h r is tia n  F a th e r-

ing’’-September 29 
“ P re p a rin g  for

Adolescence’’-P a rt I; The 
O rigins of S elf-D oub t- 
October 6; Part II: Peer 
Pressure and Sexuality- 
October 13.

“What Wives Wish Their 
H usbands Knew About 
Women”-P a rt I ; The lx>nely 
Housewife-October 20; Part 
II ; Money, Sex and Children- 
■October 27.

This program is free of 
charge and open to the 
public with free child care 
available.
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Loboes Drop Season Opener 
To Haskell Indians 19 to 6

The Cisco I/)boes dropped 
their season opener to the 
Haskell Indians by the score 
of 19 to 6 here Friday night.

A field-soaking rain prior 
to Friday night’s game 
seemed to make the football 
extra slippery and both 
teams fumbled numerous 
times. Each team lost five of 
nine fumbles

Although neither team got 
any points on the scoreboard 
during the first half of the 
game, the Ixiboes made at 
least one actual threat while 
Haskell made two

H askell’s firs t th rea t 
followed a 33-yard drive 
from Cisco’s 41-yard line to 
the eight. On a fourth down 
and seven yards to go, 
Haskell’s Joe Benavides 
tried an unsuccessful field 
goal.

Cisco’s attempt at a score 
was sparked by I..obo Bubba 
Eaker recovering an Indian 
fum ble a t the Haskell 
40-yard line. On the first 
play, Cisco quarterback 
Randall Rattan made six 
yards and seemed to hurt his 
hand. Back-up quarterback 
Doug Hendricks took over 
the Ix)bo helm and made 
four yards on the next play 
for a Cisco first down. A han- 
doff from Hendricks to Gary 
Speegle netted two more 
yards placing the ball on 
Ha.skell's 28-yard line. On 
the next play, a second down 
with eight yards to go, (JB 
Hendricks was hit hard 
before he could get rid of the 
ball and fumbled. Haskell’s 
Ixinnie Hise recovered the 
ball on the Indians' 32-yard 
line killing Cisco's threat.

H askell’s Lonnie Hise 
recovered another Cisco 
fumble late in the first half 
at Cisco’s 41-yard line. In­
dian quarterback Albert 
.Shemian connected with a 
pass to Joe Ortiz for the first 
down putting the ball on 
C isco ’s 26-yard line. Indian 
Benavides picked up one 
yard on a handoff from 
Haskell QB Sherman. On the 
next play, Cisco’s Rattan 
picked off a Haskell pass at 
the Ixiboes two yard line for 
the last play of the first half.

Haskell’s Curtis F’orehand 
received the second half 
kick-off a t the Indians 
25-yard line and ran it back 
to the 30 before being tackl­
ed. Three plays later Cisco 
recovered a Haskell fumble 
at the Indians 34-yard line.

Cisco drove to Haskell’s 
nine-yard line in four plays 
with yardage m ade on 
passes from QB Rattan to 
Jason Potter and I>arry 
Adams. Nine yards from the 
goal line, Cisco fumbled and 
Haskell recovered the ball

The Indians fumbled the 
ball on their first play and 
Cisco recovered at the 
15-yard line to set up the first 
scoring drive of the game.

A ten-yard run by Potter 
moved the ball to Haskell's 
five-yard line where a han­
doff to Speegle netted the 
touchdown. A Ixibo try for 
two extra points resulted in 
an incomplete pass, making 
the score 6 to 0 with 9:16 left 
in the third quarter.

E a r ly  in the fourth  
quarter, Cisco recovered a 
fumble to stop a Haskell 
drive at Cisco’s ten-yard 
line. Cisco then fumbled the 
ball on their first play and 
Haskell recovered at the 14.

Haskell QB Sherman kept 
the ball for two plays gaining 
six yards. A handoff to 
Benavides got the first down 
four yards from the goal ine. 
On the next handoff, this 
time to Jonnie Hise, Haskell 
scored its first touchdown. 
The extra point kick by 
Benavides was blocked, ty­
ing the score 6 to 6 with 8:23

left in the fourth quarter.
The Ixiboes received the 

ball and started their drive 
on Cisco’s 38-yard line. A 
handoff to Potter gained one 
yard and the next play, a 
pass, was intercepted by 
Haskell’s James Davis at the 
I/)boes 38-yard line.

Six plays later, Haskell’s 
Benavides took the ball in 
from two yards out to widen 
the Indians lead Jonnie Hise 
helped move the ball during 
the drive since he picked up 
34 yards in four carries. The 
extra point kick by Haskell’s 
Mark Bailey was good mak­
ing the score 13 to 6 with 5:12 
leh in the game.

Cisco took the kick but was 
unable to gain a first down in 
four plays and was on 
Cisco’s 37-yard line. Cisco’s 
Rattan fumbled the ball on 
the punt play and Haskell 
recovered on Cisco’s 25-yard 
line.

Handoffs to Haskell’s Jon­
nie Hise and Benavides gain­
ed two first downs in seven 
plays and put the ball one 
yard from Cisco’s goal line. 
Indian Benavides took the 
next handoff in for the 
touchdown. The extra point 
kick by Bailey was good 
making the final score 19 to 6 
with 12 seconds left in the 
game.

O ustand ing  defensive  
players for the Cisco Loboes 
were Brian Fleming, Gary 
Speegle, Manuel Marquez, 
Shane Posey, Joey Worley, 
Tommy Thackerson, Blair 
Boyd, Danny Garcia Jason 
Potter, Larry Adams, Bubba 
Eaker, Brad Hawari and 
Bud Wood.

Standouts on the Haskell 
Indians defense were Curtis 
Forehand, Joe Benavides, 
Joe Ortiz, Paul Barnett, Ixm- 
nie Hise, James Davis, Jon­
nie Hise, Jay Druesdow, 
Joseph Toliver, Jim Roberts 
and David Wheatley.

STATISTICS

Michael Puryear 
Selected to 1981 
Outstanding Men

Michael Pope Puryear, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Puryear, has been selected 
for inclusion in the 1981 edi­
tion of Outstanding Young 
Men of America. He was 
selected from nominations 
received from Senators, 
Congressmen, Governors, 
Mayors, State Legislators, 
U niversity  and College 
Presidents and Deans as 
well as various civic groups, 
including the United State 
Jaycees which also endorses 
the Outstanding Young Men 
of America program.

In every community there 
are young men working 
diligently to make their 
cities, as well as their coun­
try, better places in which to 
live. These men, having 
distinguished themselves in 
one or more fields of 
endeavor, are outstanding 
and deserve to be recognized 
for their achievements. The 
criteria for selection include 
a man’s voluntary service to 
com m unity, professional 
le a d e rsh ip , acad em ic  
achievement, business ad­
vancem ent, cultural ac­
complishments and civic 
and political participation.

Puryear, along with fellow 
Outstanding Young Men 
throughout North America, 
will be featured in this 
prestigious annual awards 
publication.

F'irst Downs: Cisco 6 ; 
Haskell 12

Rushing Yardage; Cisco 
46, Haskell 176 

Passing Yardage; Cisco 
106; Haskell 29 

Passes Completed: Cisco 5 
of 10; Haskell 2 of 5

Intercepted by: Cisco 1; 
Haskell 1

Punts, Average: Cisco 4 
for 15; Haskell 3 for 25 

Penalties, Yards: Cisco 3 
for 35; Haskell 3 for 35 

Fumbles Lost: Cisco 5; 
Haskell 5.

Jr. Hiah And 
J.V . Teams 
To Play Here

Cisco Junior-Senior High 
School’s seventh, eighth and 
Junior Varsity teams will be 
playing against Baird teams 
in Cisco Thursday.

Seventh grade teams will 
start playing at 5:00 p.m., 
the eighth at 6:00 p.m. and 
the Junior Varsity at 7:30 
p.m.
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High School Loboes To 
Play Friday In Baird

C .J.C . Wrangler Football Action

The Loboes of Cisco High 
School will take to the road 
this week and play the Baird 
Bears on their home field. 
Kick-off will be at 8 p.m. in 
Baird.

The Loboes lost their 
season opener last Friday to 
Haskell at Chesley Field in 
Cisco. Their next home 
game will be October 9 when 
they face Early.

Baird’s Bears are coming 
off a big win against Cross 
Plains last Friday. They won 
34 to 6.

Cisco Coach Jim Puryear 
said Baird ran seven offen­
sive plays against Cross 
Plains and scored three 
touchdowns, then they slow­
ed up their offense Accor­
ding to Coach Puryear, Cisco 
scouts repo rt B aird is

CofC Quarterly 
Breakfast Sept. 16
Cham ber of Commerce 
Q u a rte rly  M em bership  
Breakfast Set for Sept. 16 

The regular Chamber of 
Com m erce m em bersh ip  
b reak fast will be held 
September 16. Everyone is 
invited to attend these “get 
to g e th e r ’’ fe llow ship  
meetings. A rS.OO member 
attendance prize will be 
awarded. Must be there to 
win. The breakfast is $3.50 
and reservations may be 
m ade by ca llin g  the 
Chamber office at 442-2537.

G C  Wranglers Romp Post 
Abilene's McMurry J.V . 23-7

By Bill Roberts
The Cisco Junior College 

W ranglers prepared for 
T h u rsd a y ’s 7:30 p.m . 
meeting with the Southern 
M ethodist U n iv ersity  
Mustang Junior Varsity last 
Saturday with a 23-7 victory 
over the McMurry College 
JV.

Coach Bill Anderson and 
his assistants used balanced 
running and passing attacks 
to offset one long scoring 
bomb by the Indians to post 
the victory in the season 
opener for both teams.

Anderson and his staff will 
be hard pressed to come up 
with a knowledgable game 
plan for the Mustangs, since 
they are a little known quan­
tity. The SMU varsity posted 
a solid 48-0 victory over the 
University of Texas at Arl­
ington Saturday, and it is 
well known that most junior 
varsities follow the same 
game plan of the varsity.

“They will probably run 
the slot-I like the varsity,” 
says Anderson, but he 
hastens to add, “when you’re 
playing them, or anybody 
else for that matter, you’ve 
got to be prepared for 
an.vthing."

The Wrangler boss, begin­
ning his fourth year at the 
helm, watched his squad 
from his usual perch in the 
top section of the press box 
at Chesley P'ield Saturday, 
and was pretty well satisfied 
with the effort-in most ca.ses 
at least.

i  thought we’d catch the 
ball better than we did and 
our backs were not reacting 
like I wish they would. We 
were running a little tight. 
We did drop some passes and 
our passer wasn’t as sharp 
as we’d like. We looked like 
you’d expect us to look the 
first game”

Efforts by tailbacks Billy 
Richardson and Keith Pan- 
tallion helped keep the of­
fense rolling throughout the 
gam e, as did s ta rtin g  
tailback Mark Neville, who 
left the game early with a 
bruised collar bone

Richardson finished the 
game as the leading rusher, 
averaging 8.6 yards a carry 
with 69 yards on eight car-

ries. Pantallion, who scored 
two of the Wrangler’s three 
touchdowns, finished the 
night with 37 yards on five 
carries for a 7.4 average.

CJC used three quarter­
backs in the victory, with 
sophomore John Farris hav­
ing the best night passing. 
The South Garland graduate 
completed 12 of 25 passes for 
128 yards. Paul Williams, 
Richard Davis and Johnny 
Yglecias each completed one 
pass. Yglecias suffered the 
only interception of the even­
ing.

Overall, the Wranglers 
rolled up .383 yards in total 
offense while holding the In­
dians to 108-38 yards on the 
ground and 70 yards in the 
air. The Wranglers, who 
finished as the No. 4 passing 
offense in the nation last 
year among junior colleges, 
had 180 yards passing and 
203 on the ground.

Sophomore Matt Ligón 
finished the game as the 
leading receiver with three 
receptions for 32 yards. 
Richardson pulled down two 
for 25 yards and Barrette 
Douglas two for 24 yards.

.McMurry got the ball first 
but was unable to gain more 
than four yards against the 
Wrangler defense. CJC took 
over at its own 38 and march­
ed to paydirt in only eight 
plays. Five and 15-yard runs 
by Neville and a 24-yard 
scamper by Richardson set 
the Wranglers up at the In­
dians 13. Sidney Harper put 
CJC on the scoreboard with a 
three-yard run with 10 
minutes left in the opening 
quarter

That’s the way the game 
remained until the third 
quarter, but the remainder 
of the first half was not 
without excitement. Trying 
to field an Indian punt late in 
the first quarter, a Wrangler 
receiver couldn’t hang onto 
the ball and an alert Don 
Unberry fell on it for the In­
dians, setting McMurry up 
at the CJC 35. This drive 
stalled on a fourth and five 
try when Ron King was stop­
ped after only a yard. Then, 
after the next Wrangler 
se r ie s . W rangler Tony 
Brooks stepped under a Todd

Collins pass and picked it off 
to stop yet another Indian 
drive.

L a te r  in the second 
quarter, with the Indians 
buried deep in their own ter­
ritory, Jeff Osborne got a 
hand on a Collins punt and 
W rangler Bryan Reese 
scooped it up and raced the 
14 yards untouched into the 
end zone. However, an il­
legal motion penalty against 
the Wranglers erased that 
six-pointer.

On their second possession 
of the second half, the 
Wranglers finally got a drive 
going and marched 54 yards 
in nine plays with Pantallion 
going the final yard. The 
touchdown was set up by 
runs of 11 yards by Neville 
and nine yards by Farris and 
a 12-yard pass from Farris to 
Ligón. Kiomars “ F red ” 
Rezaie booted his second ex­
tra point for a 14-0 Wrangler 
lead with 6:11 left in the third 
quarter.

A three-play, 35-yard drive 
at the beginning of the fourth 
quarter pushed the Wrangler 
lead to 21-0. Farris again hit 
Ugon for a 13-yard pass to 
move the ball to the Indian 22 
and then executed a perfect 
roll-out option play to Pan­
tallion, who took the ball and 
raced to the goalline with 
13:59 showmg on the clock.

Rezaie, a freshman from 
Sulphur Springs, had three 
perfect extra point kicks for 
the night-and one field goal 
try. Playing his first year of 
football, “Fred,” as most of 
the CJC students and faculty 
call him, was a bit disap­
pointed at a hobbled field 
goal try  in the second 
qauarter. It would have been 
a 34-yarder had he gotten it 
off, but the holder couldn’t 
handle it. Observers say 
“Fred” has hit from 50 yards 
out in practice.

The Indians finally got on 
the scoreboard with 8:06 left 
in the game-and it took only 
one p lay . Follow ing a 
34-yard punt by Wrangler 
Lloyd Voight, the Indians set 
up at their own .38_ ¿.nd 
quarterback Todd Mund 
lofted one to wingback Mike 
Alexander, who gathered it 
in at the CJC 22, beating two

Wrangler defenders, and 
raced to the end zone. Chip 
Matthews then cut the lead 
to 21-7 with his PAT boot.

The scoring wasn’t over, 
however. The Wranglers had 
backed the Indians up to 
their own four, and with 
fourth and seven, David Cof­
fey waited for the snap just 
inside his own end line. 'The 
snap was hobbled, and see­
ing no chance at all for a 
kick, Coffey simply stood 
alone in the end zone and 
waited to be touched by a 
Wrangler. The safety provid­
ed the 23-7 winning margin 
for the Wranglers.

Anderson had praise for 
Voight, who handled the pun­
ting chores, but felt the 
specialty teams need work. 
“Our kick fielding was the 
most disappointing part of 
our game. We thought our 
coverage would be bad-and 
it was. We lost two fumbles 
on punts. I’d like to find 
somebody that could do it all 
the time (return punts),” he 
added.

Obviously, that will be one 
phase of the game which will 
command some attention as 
the Wranglers prepare for 
the Mustangs. Most coaches 
in small colleges feel that 
teams with a lot of scholar­
ships to offer have a little 
m ore ta le n t, and the 
W ranglers will have a 
tougher group of that type of 
team to play this year. 
Following the game with 
SMU, CJC will play the 
Texas Tech JV (Sept. 17), 
R anger Ju n io r College 
(Sept. 26), UT-Arlington 
(Oct. 1), West Texas State 
JV (Oct. 8), TCU JV (Oct. 
16), Fort Hood (Oct. 22), 
New Mexico Military In­
stitute (Oct. 31), and last 
year’s No. 1 junior college 
team . N o rth e as te rn  
Oklahoma A8tM (Nov. 7).

It was the NEO aquad 
which handed the Wranglers 
their only loss in an 8-1 
season in 1980

So plan to be at the Colony 
Restaurant at 7:00 a.m. 
September 16.

Gsco P-TO To 
Hold Board 
Meeting Thursday

The Cisco P-TO will hold 
an executive board meeting 
T h u rsd ay  m orn ing , 
September 10, at 9:30 o’clock 
at the Chamber of Com­
merce office.

All officers and room 
mothers are urged to attend. 
Main topics of discussion for 
the meeting will be the 
September 21-25 member­
ship drive and Halloween 
parties.

Country And 
Western Musicol 
Set In Gsco

The country and western 
musical will be in Cisco 
Saturday, September 12, at 
7:00 p.m. in the Corral 
Room, Avenue D.

The public is extended an 
invitation to attend.

P-TO Officers 
Installed At 
Gose of Yeor

P-TO officers for the 
1981-82 school year were 
elected and installed at the 
close of the last school year. 
The new officers are as 
follows: Bettye McGinness, 
president; Joy Worley, first 
vice p re s id e n t; P au la  
Elliott, second vice presi­
dent; Doris Lundstrom, 
se c re ta ry ; Kay R oark, 
treasurer; Jerry Choate, 
parliamentarian.

Appointed officers for the 
new year are Diane Carlile, 
ways and means committee; 
dlarla Arnold, health com­
mittee; Katie Baird and 
Arlene Thompson, telephone 
committee; Cheryl Wilker- 
son, community service 
committee; and Judy Callar- 
man, publicity.

As its first activity of the 
year, the P-TO held a coffee 
to show appreciation for all 
the Cisco teachers. The 
event took place in the high 
school cafeteria Monday, 
August 24.

Decorations of bright red 
apples carried out the “Back 
to School” theme. Philpott 
the Florist donated an ar­
rangement of white daisies, 
which were given to Mrs. 
M artha  D av is, school 
secretary, after the coffee.

P-TO o fficers  served  
refreshments of homemade 
sweet rolls, melon balls, can­
taloupe balls and coffee.

quicker and tougher than 
Haskell, so a hard game is 
expected.

About last Friday’s game 
ag a in st H askell, Coach 
Puryear said, “We did not 
play well. We hope to correct 
some mistakes and play bet­
ter against Baird.”

He also said the Loboes 
are all well and Mark Hum­
phries, who broke his ankle 
before school started, got the 
cast off his foot Saturday. 
Coach Puryear said it will be 
several weeks before he will 
play.

The lineup for this week’s 
game will be about the same 
as last week’s, with different 
com binations of players 
before District play begins 
O ctober 2nd ag a in s t 
Eastland.

This year’s roster in­
cludes: Randall Rattan, of­
fensive quarterback and 
defensive secondary; Danny 
Garcia, offensive wideout, 
denfensive secondary; Doug 
H en d rick s, o ffensive  
q u a r te rb a c k , d efensive  
secondary; Mike Gallegos, 
offensive end, defensive 
lineman; Blair Boyd, offen­
sive end , d efen siv e  
linebacker; Jason Potter, of­
fensive quail, defensive 
secondary; Shane Posey, of­
fensive fullback, defensive 
linebacker; B rim  Fleming, 
offensive quail, defensive 
seondary; Gary Speegle, of­
fensive fullback, defensive 
linebacker; Larry Adams, 
offensive wideout, defensive 
secondary; Bud Wood, offen­
sive c e n te r , defensive  
lineman; Brad Hawari, of­
fensive lineman, defensive 
lineman; Mark Humphries, 
offensive lineman, defensive 
lineman; Mark Petree, of­
fensive lineman, defensive 
lin e b a c k e r ;  K enneth 
Preston, offensive lineman, 
defensive lineman; Tommy 
T h ack erso n , o ffensive 
center, defensive secon­
dary; Terry Owings, offen­
sive linem an, defensive 
lineman; Sean Maniré, of­
fensive lineman, defensive 
lineman; Bubba Eaker, of­
fensive lineman, defensive 
lineman; Manual Marquez, 
offensive lineman, defensive 
lineman and Joey Worley, 
offensive and defensive 
lineman.

Coaches are Jim Puryear, 
□yde Evatt, Tom Slagle, 
D anny K ent and  Ron 
Mouser

Auto Domagad in 
Friday Aeddont

Charlie Lefores, 22, of 
Cisco, suffered cuts and 
bruises and his automobile 
was damaged extensively 
when it struck a large sign 
post at Allsup’s convenience 
store on West 8th Street Mon­
day. Lefores was treated at 
E.L. G raham  M em orial 
Hospital and released.

Acting Police Chief Larry 
Jemigan said investigating 
o ff ic e rs  re p o rte d  th a t 
Lefores told them his brakes 
failed as he turned into the 
store parking lot and he was 
unable to avoid hitting the 
pole. Police said the pole 
would have to be replaced.
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'ló P R T C H
The United Stotes Kos Reserve Oil In Storoge

Eastland County 
Oil News Report

Thursday, S«pt«mb«r

In order not to get 
caught in ano ther 
severe oil shortage 
similar to the once fac­
ed by the United States 
following the 1973-74 
Arab oil embargo, the 
federal government 
established a Strategic 
Petroleum  Reserve

(SPR) in 1975.

Congress authorized 
a 500-million-barrels 
storage program using 
five underground salt 
domes located along 
the Texas-Louisiana 
Gulf Coast which is be­
ing filled at an average

■ ■ ■ ■ m m
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rate of 325,000 barrels 
of crude daily, accor­
ding to the American 
Petroleum Institute in 
Washington, D.C.

The program, which 
was increased from 
the original 400 million 
barrels to 1 billion bar­
rels, call for half the 
total to be in storage by 
Dec. 22. As of Aug. 3,
173.1 million barrels
had been stored in the 
five locations which in- 
ludes; Bryan Mound, 
Texas - 63.1 million 
barrels; Bayou Choc­
taw, La. - 35.5 million 
b a rre ls ;  W.
Hackberry, La. - 41.7 
m illion b a rre ls ;  
Sulphur Mines, La. - .6 
million barrels; and 
Weeks Island, La. - 32.2 
million barrels.

The cost of the 
original 500-barrels 
p rog ram  was
estimated at about $8 
billion and the final, 
1-billion barrel pro­
gram, $20 billion. The 
price tag on developing 
the storage facilities 
was $875.9 nullion and 
the purchase of the
173.1 million barrels 
stored to date, $3.6 
billion.

The biggest source of 
the oil stored now was 
the North Sea 
(England) with 53.7
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million barrels follow­
ed by: Mexico, 34.6 
million barrels; Libya, 
23.5; Iran, 18.2; and 
Alaska, 16.4. Nigeria, 
Saudi A rab ia , 
E cuado r, A lgeria , 
Dubai, Egypt, Norway 
and Venezuela each 
shipped amounts less 
than 10 percent for the 
SPR.

From 1977 through 
early 1979 delays were 
encountered in the pro- 
gram  because the 
storage sites were not 
completed. A second 
delay, which halted the 
deliverly of oil to the 
sites until September 
1980, was caused by: 
federal budget con­
sideration; a “tight” 
crude oil market in 
1979 brought about par­
tially because of the 
halt in Iranian oil 
shipments; an agree­
ment at the Tokyo 
Economic Sum m it, 
which included the 
United States, not to 
place undue pressure 
on world oil prices by 
purchasing oil for 
strategic stockpiles; 
and attitude among 
som e of the oil- 
supplying nations.

1 Arrested In 
Untaxed Diesel 
Smuggling
AUSTIN-Efforts to halt the 
smuggling of untaxed diesel 
fuel along the Texas-Mexico 
border Friday resulted in the 
a rre s t of a S8-year-old 
Loredo man, according to 
S ta te  C om ptro ller Bob 
Bullock.

Bullock’s investigation 
showed an estimated 100 
million gallons of untaxed 
fuel was coming into Texas 
from Mexico each year.

“I intend to put the contra­
band fuel business out-of­
business because these 
smugglers are stealing from 
the taxpayers in this state,” 
Bullock said.

Texas taxes diesel fuel at 
s u  and a half cents a gallon 
with the revenue going to 
highway and state education 
funds.

Inexpensive diesel fuel in 
Mexico sometimes as low as 
17 cents a gallon helped 
create the black market for 
fuel in Texas.

Texas routinely collects 
taxes on more than a billion 
gallons of diesel fuel a year 
sold by legitimate dealers.

New Tests Eastland
Taylor O perating 

Co., Bridgeport, filed 
applications to drill 
three wildcats in the 
Sipe Springs (Marble 
F a lls )  F ie ld  in 
Eastland County.

No. 1 Clark-Eek is 
located four miles nor­
thwest of Sipe Springs 
on a 326-acre lease.

Drillsite is 800 feet 
from the north and 
2,600 fait from the west 
lines of T&NO Survey, 
A-951.

Perm it depth ap­
plied for is 3,300 feet.

The other two tests 
are slated for 3,200 
feet.

No. 1 Bessie Mc­
Collum is located on a 
160-acre lase five miles 
south and 700 feet from 
the east lines of Daniel 
H. McFammin Survey, 
A-370.

Location for No. 1

YOUR LOW-VOLUME GAS 
CAN MAKE YOU MONEY

A cost-efficient £tiniinatox 1 gas compressor can make your low volume 
wells profitable by economically compressing your gas volumes from as low 
as 20 mcf up to 300 mcf.

And just as importantly, the electrically powered 
£CimLnatoi 1 lets you sell 100% of your’valuable 

gas, and you have minimum downtime with 
the automatic on and off feature.

Let Greenbriar Energy show you how to 
make your low-volume gas operations more 
profitable.

Oltlributcd by:

G reenbriar Oil Tools, Inc.
P O Box 1895  •  (915)332-0331  

Odessa. Texas 7 9 7 6 0

Sales Mgr., Tom Lee

Stevens is three miles 
southeast of Rising 
Star on a 160-acre 
lease.

Drillsite is 500 feet 
from the north and 
2,350 feet from the west 
lines of Section 30, 
BBB&C Survey.

P a rk er Operating 
Co. Inc., Fort Worth 
spotted two locations 
one-half mile south of 
Scranton in the Scran­
ton Field.

E ach  p ro jec t is

Oil related businestes 
We have the best loca­

tion
in Eastland for your 

business
In the New Pogue In­

dustrial
Park located across 

Highway 80 from Ser­
vice

PIple & Supply 
Sell by the lot or acre 

A-1 Sales 
215 S. Walnut 

629-2102 Anytime

located on a 166-acre 
lease and slated for 
1,750 feet.

No. 2 Neely spots 550 
feet from the north and 
150 feet from the west 
lines of Section 127, 
Block 3, H&TC Survey.

Site for No. 3 Neely is

1,150 feet fro the north 
and 150 feet from thè 
west lines of Section 
127.

Triple S Roustabout
Kenneth Sowell S G fV iC O  Stuart Sowell 

FULLY INSURED & 
EQUIPPED

R O U S T A a O U T  C R fW S  |
W in c h  T ru c k s .

W a id a r , B u lld o z a r  
P ip a  T ro i la r ,

T o o k  S k id s  E x t r a  Lo n g  P o la t

n T L (817) 725-7731
Dump Truck 725.7444 — 725-7625

Box 575 
Cross Plains 

76443

Dumi Bock Hoe

portable service 
J4 hours

in s u r e d

PRYOR WELDING INC.
PO  80» S*1 401 *1 '3«|

asco ií»As »S431

WAYNE PHYO« 
JERRY CARTER

817/44? ?565 
817/442 1890

P 7 r

AERIAL’BUCKET TRUCKS a  MOLE DIGGERS a  DITCH DIGGERS

CARROLL ELECTRIC SERVICE CO.
ELECTRICAL MAINTENANCE CONSTRUCTION

0«. r«LD  c o m m er o a l  s  r es id en t ia l

PO  B0I(B»I 
EASTLAND TEXAS TS448

RON CARROLLOWNER

Bus 817/629^284?
629-6793 

Night 629-1320

Do You Have 
A Question 

About
Your Minerals?
Office 629-2151 

210 Exchange Bldg.
Eastland Home 629-2093

If you’ve got
the gas... 
We’ve got
the line

Northern Gas Products Company is con­
structing a low pressure gathering system 
and 50-mile pipeline to transport gas from a 
large pwrtion of north central Texas to its 
processing plant in Hood County. The new 
pipeline, which originates in southern 
Eastland County, will be in service by 
early fall

Northern Gas Products Company also 
provides a full range of gas liquids 
services from transportation to 
marketing We can 
handle all of your 
gas processing needs

We re a part of InterNorth, Inc., a $3 
billion, energy-based company involved in 
natural gas, liquid fuels, petrochemicals, oil 
and gas exploration and coal. We've been in 
the gas processing business for over 20 
years and we operate six gas processing 
plants in Texas alone.

Call us collect to find out more about 
what we can do for you. Our Regional 
Manager is John Hon and he can be reached 
at 713-940-5264. Or. call Larry Eledge,

Director of Gas 
Liquids Acquisitions, 
at 713-940-5356.

Northern 
Gas Products 
Company

P.O. Dox 4420 
Houston, TX 77210



S IX n  THREE YEARS -  
THOUSANDS OF HAIRCUTS

By Viola M. Payne 
E ven  now a s tra y  

custoiner who hasn’t learned 
of the retirement of Cisco 
barber T.E. (Red) Owens 
wiU come by the shop in 
Eight Street (just west of 
Ave. D) hoping for one of 
Owens good $2.00 haircuts. 
The customer is disap­
pointed and a bit shocked 
when he finds the shop clos­
ed. For, after a person has 
barbered in the same town 
for 63 years, his shop 
becomes a fixture of the 
place • something no one 
wants to give up.

“ Yes, I began my barber 
work here in 1918, during 
World War I," Owens says, 
over at his home on the east 
side of Cisco. “ I closed up 
my shop for the last time on 
July 28th. I wouldn’t have 
stopped  then , but my 
eyesight was beginning to 
fail. I couldn’t be sure, on the 
close work, that I was doing 
the kind of job I wanted for 
my customers.’’

Other than this trouble 
with his vision, Owens - 
almost 83 yrs. old. feels 
great. He walked 36 blocks 
the other day, and has 
remarkable strength for his 
years. He would like to get 

with his woodworking

-  »

Mr. Owens with a customer

on

hobby, for he builds fine gun 
racks, tables, and other 
things.

“ But you need good 
eyesight to work at that too,’’ 
he notes.

Just before Owens closed 
his Barber Shop, he also 
signed off on a remarkable 
interest he had followed

tBOOOOOOOOOOOIDOOOOOOOOO o oooooooooo
Bookkeeping and Tax Service

Ken Porrock
205 East Main. Ranger, 647-3022 

Hi North Seanan, Eastland, 629-8641

INCOMI TAX RETURNS 
MONTHLT AND QUARTERLT

REPORTING FOR BUSINESSES
Individual, Partnership, and Corporation Tax Returns

o ?

1Ì

Ì»

TO SCHOOL 
SPECIAL!

New.shipment of 
Men’s Wrangler 
Jeans. Boot cut 

and Cowboy cut,
• 1 5 ”

¿Women’s Sportswear*
"" V4 O f f

David & Quetta’s oH
1-20 Wi l t

since Jan., 1946 • that of 
recording the details of Cisco 
weather morning and even­
ing. These records, which 
w ere m ade with 
sophisticated equipment, 
are carefully tabulated on 
pages of lined paper stapled 
together in proper order. 
Data is readily available for 
any interested person. Ap­
parently no other such local 
record exists.

“ I really enjoyed working 
with this," Owens says in his 
clear voice. "I got to where, 
after studying the charts, I 
could pretty near forecast 
the weather.”

His weather forecasting, 
like his barbering and some 
other things in his life, had to 
be mostly self-taught. He 
did, however, take some 
voire training at Randolph 
College. He also studied 
Voice C ulture by co r­
respondence from a music 
school in Chicago - and said 
it helped him do a better job 
of leading out with the sing­
ing at the Chruch of Christ. 
He doesn’t sing so much in 
public anymore, he men­
tions.

“Too many young people 
coming on with good, trained 
voices.”

See M .H . Perry for 
D ISA B ILITY  
INSURANCE 

629-1566 or 629-1095 
104 N Lamar-East land.

SCO TTY’S BARN 
M ISCELLAN EO US 

PAINTING AND M ETAL 
CRA FT

1315 S . Lamar, Eastland. I 
paint lawn furniture, ap­
pliances, metal awnings- 
metal gates-corral panels- 
also polish and wax automo­
biles. Come by or call L .A . 
Scott. T-C

AUCTION
Saturday, September 12, 1981

1 0 : 0 0  AM
217 !Vluiii Street, Ranger, Texas

Thi s  is t he  sale  o f  the  j  

t he  His tor ie
■I ( T i i i r e l i  l ’e « «

S t i l a l i  H  o l i l i d  O i i k  l i i i i i i i u  l i i l i l e  

S i i i a l l  I le K k »
(>iiM l l e i i l e r >

T i i> * e U . S l i e e l » .  I t l a n k e l « .  e i e .  

M i i i i t  O l d  V . \ . \

S t i l a l i  D i i i i i i g  r i i l i l e »

S i i i a l l  D i i i e l l e  S i i i i e *

M a i i y  S i r a i g l i l  H a e k e d  ( l i a i r >  

S l i i f f e d  l ' I i a i r »
V iM id e i i  a n d  M e t a l  B e i U l e a i U  

Tot.
O l d  V h i -i i i i i i i  (  l e i i i i e r  

W h h Ii B o a r d  
M iM ’e l l a i i e o i i «  l> i« lie «

M n i iv  < T ie » l»  o f  D r i m e r *

M n i iy  l l r e . e r *

S e . e r a l  S i f a »  a m i  l , m e « e i i l «

urn  it a re a n d  c o n t e n t s  
(Aiolson Hote l

\ p p r o \ ,  2 0  l l o e k i n g  I l i i i i r «

O l d  K e f r i g e r i i i o r «  | l l ie y  r u n . )

I t e d ' i d e  I a b l e  

O l d  l• ^ l •  t  o o k « lo » e « i^

O l d  I t o p e r  (> iio  H a l i t e  
O l d  N e w  M e l l i o d  (> ii>  R a n g e  

S in n I I  D r o p l e i i f  I n b l e  

l l e i i r l M i r n  M e n l e r  
O l d  I ' r e d d l e  S e n i i i g  M i i e b i i i e  

2  M n l e b i i i g  l . o i i g e  B e d  

( l i i i i a  ( i i b i i i e l  

( , l n e i ‘n  \ n n e * «  H n f f e i  

2  M i 'l a l  e l o . e l «  

l) i> p la %  S h e l l  e*
O l d  K o l l l e  (  n l l e e l i o n  

l . g .  D o u b l e  l)e i> k
I ' l  l  S  M \ N T  I T E M S  T I M »  .M  M E R O l  S  

r o  M K M  I O V

For  I n f o r m a t i o n  Call:
F r e d  T n e k e r ( d l 7 ^  62^-/956

TUCKER AUCTION COMPANY
Auctioneer: Fred Tucker — TXS-081-1152 

Rt. 1 Box 90 
Fastland, Texan 76448 

(817) 629-1956 
Licensed and Bonded

Oweris was a Deacon in the 
Church of Christ for more 
than 20 years. He also 
assisted  In the Sunday 
School and with the work of 
Treasurer.

T.E. Owens was bom to 
Zach and Florida Owens in 
(Therokkee County, Georgia, 
on the 24th of Sept., 1898. He 
was the youngest of four 
children, and his father was 
a farmer. Both his Mother 
and Father were Irish.

Like many people of that 
time, the Owens family 
heard of Eastland County 
through relatives, and hoped 
to better themselves here. 
They arrived in Eastland by 
train right after Christmas 
in 1898, and went to the home 
of an Uncle Jake Rhyne near 
Carbon. Soon 21ach Owens 
rented land near Sipes Spr­
ings and Okra, and then in a 
community near Flatwood.

Little red haired T.E. 
spent his early years on 
these farms, where cotton, 
maize, and com were grown. 
Then, when he was only ten 
years old, his father died of 
pneumonia.

The oldest son tried to 
make a living for the family, 
but it was not easy. They liv­
ed on several places south of 
Cisco, and T.E. had no 
chance to a ttend  High 
School. In 1913 the family 
moved into Cisco, and by 
then he had to get the best 
jobs he could find.

This included work for the 
City, at the Oil Mill, and for 
the T .P . R ailroad. But 
Owens was interested in 
barbering, and found plenty 
of people to practice on. Soon 
he found that his cutting and 
styling was quite acceptable, 
although he had not attended 
any of the Barber Colleges of 
that day.

In 1918 a man named John 
Swindle asked T.E. to help 
him in a Barber Shop. Even 
with haircuts at .15 cents and 
shaves at .10 cents T.E. 
found that his skill paid more 
than other types of work he 
could do.

Soon afterward Swindle 
sold out and moved to 
California, but T.E. began 
working for other Barbers. 
And during this firat year of 
barbering he married a local 
(•irl named Lena Hall.

The Santa Claus Bank 
Robbery, in Dec. 1927, was 
an unforgettable experience 
for T.E. Owens. For it just 
happened that he was walk­
ing near the front of the 
Cisco Bank when the 
shooting started! At first he 
thought the noise was only 
firecrackers, for there were 
no re s tr ic tio n s  ag a in st 
fireworks in those days. But 
he soon learned differently, 
when he saw a wounded man 
fall and the get-away car 
speed off. <

This violent episode was

See M .H . Perry for 
EDUCATIO N AL

in s u r a n c e
629-1566 or 629-1095 
104 N. Lam ar-Easlland

J A A Borgain Box 
701 W. Main 
New A Used 
Merchandise 

629-1133

not typical of Cisco in the 
1920’s - generally the town 
was a pleasant place to live. 
But then the first part of the 
Depression, in 19^, hit T.E. 
with a hard blow. For he had 
a home all paid for, out on 
21st Street a • good place for 
his wife and children • when 
the City voted to put a sewer 
line behind his home. He 
didn’t have the extra cash to 
pay for it, so he had to mor­
tgage the home. When the 
crash came, he didn’t have 
the money to m eet his 
payments, and his house was 
foreclosed.

In 1935 his wife died, leav­
ing him with four children - 
ages 10 to 3 - to care for. This 
was a very difficult time, for 
he needed to continue with 
his barber work in order to 
support the family. With the 
help of mends and relatives 
he mananged to see that the 
children were cared for.

During the Depression the 
Barber Shops Owens was 
working for almost had to go

n sco  KAD1.4TOR 
SERVICE 

207 E. 6th St. 
(Breckenridge Hw\.l 

Cisi o. Texas 
C le a i i in g - ro d d in g -  
reco ring -au to -lruck - 
ira e lo r  ra d ia lo rs -  
iieaters. New radiator 
and heaters. Auto gas 
laiiks cleaned-repaired. 
Open Monday thru F rk 
da\. 8 a.m. to 5:30 p.m 
Call 442-1547. Cisco. 
p-Stle '

on a barter system, where 
haircuts were exchanged for 
food and other necessities.

In 1939 Owens married a 
widow whose maiden name 
had been Ruby Ezzell. This 
young woman had a 
daugh ter, Coleen, with 
almost the same name as 
one of T.E.’s daughters. Col­
een is now Coleen Strawn of 
Cisco.

Three of T.E. Owens 
children are still living - Col- 
leen Owens G reen  of 
Eastland, Tommie Owens of 
San Leandro, Calif., and 
Dorothy Owens Myers of 
Abilene. Robert Owens died 
about ten years ago. There 
are seven grandchildren in 
the family, and several 
great-grandchildren.

After working for severa' 
Barbers over the years, in­
cluding Roy Wilson for 19 
years, T.E. bought his own 
shop in the late 1940’s. He 
moved to the present loca­
tion about 30 years ago, and 
kept very busy all that time.

He has, as he says "Cut peo­
p le’s h a ir from alm ost 
everywhere - thousands of 
them.” And during his years 
of barbering he has watched 
styles rotate around, and 
often come back again. He 
started out using scissors 
and a comb, and leaving the 
hair bushy in the back. Then 
hand clippers came in, and 
finally electric clippers. 
There were the short pomps 
and long pomps, and finally 
the military-type cuts of the 
•40's and ‘50’s. The Beetles, 
Owens says, brought in the 
long hair. Now the styles 
have settled into shaped 
cuts.

In the 1920’s before Beauty 
Shops arrived, women came 
to Owens for their haircuts.

" I’ve seen the girls come 
in with long hair, and sit and 
cry when I cut it off,” he 
chuckles. “There really isn’t 
as much change in the cut­
ting of women’s hair as peo­
ple think. I did razor cuts 
long ago, and Raggedy Anns.

(Layered cuts). Then there 
was the Sweetheart Bob • 
short, and ponted in (he 
back. And I used to cut 
children’s hair - we called it 
a Buster Brown style, with 
bangs.”

On prices, Owens inched 
them up over the years, from 
the low of .15 cents, until he 
finally reached 61.00. By the 
early 1970’s he began to 
charge $1.50 and finally went 
to $2.00, reluctantly.

“ I said right then that was 
as high as I was ever going! ” 
he recalls. “I always tried to 
consider my customers."

And suddenly, as Owens 
speaks of his convictions, the 
home where he lives, and his 
street, takes on a different 
look. It may, on the surface, 
appear like a number of 
other Cisco streets - quiet, 
shady, still unpaved. But 
there is something special 
about it"- a man lives there 
who has no greed.

Thursday,
September 10, 1901

BUDDY 
AARON 

INSURANCE 

629-8533

S, Seam an 
Eastland

Olney Savings Introduces

THEALL-SAVERS C  D.
TAX FREE. BEGINS 
OCTOBER 1.
SIGN UP NOW!

Beginning October 1, 1981, Olney Savings will offer a 
1-yeor certificate which pays tax-free interest — op to 
$ 2 ,00 0  for married couples filing iointly, $ 1 ,0 0 0  for on indi­
vidual. $500  minimum required.

This tox-free feature is not the only attraction of the 
All-Savers C .D . It will also return a high yield. For many sav­
ers, the All-Savers C .D .'s tax free yield will be higher thon 
the*after-tax yield ovailable in other types of accounts. And 
the Olney Savings All-Savers C.D. is insured by the 
F.S .L.I.C ., up to $ 1 0 0 ,0 0 0 .

Come in ond talk with us about the All-Savers C .D . We re 
prepared to answer any questions you hove and we con 
begin now to set up your All-Savers C .D . We re ready to 
help.

CONVERT YOUR 
6- MONTH MONEY 
MARKET C.D. TO 
THE ALL-SAVERS 
C.D. NO PENALTY!

If youf formly 
NKom« «

Your Ton Brocket 
probably it:

Inter*» rot* needed 
to net 12 61 % otter 
Federol income ton it:

$ 2 0 , 0 0 0  or less 25% 16.81%

$25 ,000 30% 18.017*

$ 3 5 ,0 0 0 40% 2 1 .02 %

$ 5 0 ,0 0 0  or 
more

50% 25.257* I

inIw M l rott » «quoi *o 70%  ot c«ro o « «iv.ilft«««l yi»ki on on* y*<v U S In a tu r , 
B ill os of mor« rocont « k 6o« dot#

RANGER
SAVINGS

EASTLAND
W IN G S

$1,000 minimum 
2 V2 year C.D.
fcttective September B thru befpember 14 RATE

Substantial penally (or early withdravral YIELD

O ln ey , Seym our, iocksboro , Bridgeport, Nocor>a, 
W eottierlo rd , A x le , Grohom , Archer C ity , Brownwood, 
Bowie ond W ich ita Fo ils A lso Electro Savings m Elec­
tro , Ronger Sovings in Ronger, Eostlond Savings in 
EosHond A ll D ivisions ot O lney Sovings

16300%
17.930%
16.045%

This IS an annual yield. The rate is subject to change at 
maturity Federal regulations prohibit the conspounding 
of interest during the term of the occount.

T o  u s , p e o p le  a re  w o r t h  
a  w h o le  lo t m o r e  t h a n  m o n e y .

$10,000  minimum 
6-month C.D.
fcttective September B thru September 14

Substanliol penolty (or early wilhdrowal.

[e®

RANGER
W IN G S

EASTLAND
W IN G S

Come see os soon, or coll orsd we’ll eo*»e see you.
'Couse it's the Olney way to save. And icheefc out the 
Olney Savings Checking Account , . .  itipays S '/ .S  plus o 
whole lot more.

Olney, Seymour, iocksboro, Bridgeport, Nocorta, 
WWotberford, Azie, Grohom, Archer City, Brown- 
wood, Bowie and Wichita Foils. Alio Electro Sovingi 
in Electro, (longer Savings in RcMQar, Eostkmd Sov-



Thursday,
S«pt«mber 10, 1981

B a t f U i i r t
MMBorlal
Botpital

V i s i t i n g  H o u r s :
2:304:80 & 7:00^:30

Weldon W. Harris 
Michael Langnll 
Pearl Criswell 
Milabeth Copeland 
Pauline Coker 
CaUiy Speights 
Sherry Owens 
Billy Jack Copeland 
Faithie Hollander 
Thelma Setzler 
Teresa Caffey 
MatUe K. (Pat) McPherson 
Terry Wilson 
Sam E Warlord 
Martha Graves 
i>eonard L. Mcllvain 
Pearl White 
Gerald Sellars 
v'reorgc E. Dunuth 111 
laroy W. Boelter 
Kathey Hutcheson 
Henry Carter

See M  H  Perry tor
CANCER INSUP;'*. c 

6» 1 b b 6  or 1095 
104 N Lamai Eastitind 

T-C

John Welch 
Addle Cooper 
Lisxie Odessa Hutto 
Virgie Jarrett 
Aline McNelly 
Justin Wells 
Joe King 
Winnie Bassett 
l^u ra  Kennedy 
Curtis Koen 
Lyman Leach 
Virgil Wagley 
Floyd Elkins 
Charles Burnett 
Bill W. Hobbs 
Tommy L. Pope 
Lela M. Hamm 
Paula A Boyd 
Dixie A. Montgomery 
Alma O. Page 
Emma Shugart 
Cordie F Dick 
Clyde Capers 
John Mask
Tommy M. Alford Jr. 
Dorothy Pyke 
WiUie Eakin 
Geraldine Brecheen 
Grady C. Bond 
Joe Williamson 
Ann Jackson 
Dona Thomas 
Ella Medford 
Oma L Carbary 
James (Luce) Pitman 
Jim H. Baird 
Rose Blackwell 
Paul Rowch 
William Walton 
Vernon Humphreys

r ¿TllíTÜT
I OFFICE FURNITURE 
1 on d isp lay  a t
I Steven Printing
• & Photography
! E.\STI..\ND 'c
1 6 2 9 - 2 6 8 2

L.

J & J AIR CONDITIONING 
& REFRIGERATION!
Full Line Dealer

Free FNtimates i 
on Installation '

6 2 9 - 2 2 5 1
Service on All Makes'
Owner, James Schuman

WILLIAMSON
CONSTRUCTION

14 yd. Top Soil Or Sand
’60°° Per Load 

Call Williamson Const. ”  
(817)629-2894 ^

^ SISTER MARTIN *
a fyfyr  ̂ ^

^  Urn R4M« wNw« •  all q(K#'S hov# (inv •uHwr •• • vow k
A P9W «••rt hw**"* I#» th** CK»m*« P ftirw»» ww* (N# •»•f H> WciW«« »»»4 
A •  you aoiM'oiw^ Trom thw <ks« yuti **oa «r

yow 0*^4 vow* lo«od o**ot* I co*t *oH row «wfir* I hov# f# w*>«*o*1 ô o**v 
^  w So iMoro aopo>o«o<1 o<>il cow«od ovorr agoRdy fv»of**ogoe N yow aoo*w *o b# 

w<ro*icMê  «••th Ood iwck ank <•> Oody o* I coo K«4p you* Oo yew «oo*w lo
bo owOod bo< k >f* oU fk»«« y<>-> Je* < (Cf* *oO vow «who* a «vronf o*»d toll yew whe*

^  • 325 7987
U lk  SE First St. *  “**’ M ln.ro! W .ll .  j f

O M i M r a l B o s p l i a l

V i s i t i n g  H o u r s :
2:004:00 & 7:00-9:00

Arthur Tniesdell 
James Putnam 
Ruth Smith 
Minnie Bryant 
Clarence Mitchell 
Lula Ramsey 
Lura Harper 
liliian Looper
Jovinia Spoonper and Baby 
Girl
Judy Fambro
Winnie Pilgrim

E.ls.Oraham
BotplUil

V i s i t i n g  H o u r s :
_2;004:00& 6:00-8:30 ,
Beulah Simpson 
Georgia Bennett 
Juanita Neeley 
Myrtle Hawson 
Charles Moad 
Donna Davis 
Cora Thomas 
Elstella Hudson 
Roy Smith 
Seron Cook 
Grady Clark 
Herman Stephan 
John Earp 
Lela McBeth 
Gordon Murray 
Ben Howard.

Mongum Boptist 
To Celobrote 
Homecoming

Mangum Baptist (Zhurch 
will be celebrating their 77th 
anniversary and homecom­
ing this month, September 
20th. You are invited to come 
share these special times 
with all the members. Ser­
vices will begin at 11:00 a.m. 
as pastor Dwaine Gower 
will lead the singing. Bro 

Fields, a former pastor, 
will bring the morning 
message. Followmg the mor­
ning services, there will be 
an old fash ioned  
**dinner-on-the grounds", 
with a time of singing and 
fellowship to begin at 1;30 
p.m. Services will conclude 
about 3:00 p.m.

Mangum has undergone a 
facelift in the past year, and 
we are so proud of the way 
that God has blessed us. We 
invite you to come see our 
new kitchen facilities, newly 
carpeted Sunday School 
room s, and happy a t ­
mosphere. Please do try and 
come join us in this special 
time at our church.

Hope to see you there! 
Mangum Baptist Church 
Dwaine Clower, Pastor 
Mattie Donelson, Clerk

/

S A V E W IT H  ,C O N F ID E N C E !
B io s  P l y . . . P o w e r  S t r e a k  7 8

$ # b A Q i?$
l U U S m i M G S f O K n W C M

S U ( 0 /#  1* 
B IM k w a ll..

0 7 8 - 1 4  t i ts  so m e  
models of Century. 
Regal. Malibu. Nova. 
V o l a r e ,  C u t l a s s .  
LeMans. Grand Prix 
Pacer, Hornet. Grem­
lin. Aspen Challen­
ger, Z ephy r  M on­
arch. Comet

WHITEWALLS 
JUST $2.80 

MORE.

s i l t  *7 8  15 
BlackiNtll. uiu 
$.■ .Dili
•ladt

F 78-1 5 f i ts som e 
m odels of Impala 
C aprice  C heve lle . 
Century. R iviera , Le 
Sabre, Cordoba. Le 
Baron New Yorker. 
Diplomat, Delta 88. 
Toronado Om ega. 
Fury. Firebird. Cata­
lina
WHITEWALLS 

JUST $1.70 
MORE.

s i l t  S Type

Ü I  m e i  7 5 R 13 Tiempo B lackw Jll
P ie s  / fiR  13 Tiempo Whitewall 
P I 65 80B 1 5  Tiempo Blackw all 

fcR78-14 Custom Tread W hitewall 
FR78-14 Custom Tread Whitewall 
F R 7 8 -15  Custom Tread Whitewall 
G R78-15 Custom Tread Whitewall 
HR 78-1b Custom Tread Whitewall 
LR78-15 Custom Tread W hitewal[

1 S A L E  
P R IC E

F IT  d« 
lire a* 

Iradt ad*4*4
“ S49 30 $1 61

$51 85 $1 61
$52 70 $1 66
$54 75 $2 22
$57 25 ' $2 36
$58 30 $2 44
$64 20 $261
$68  95 $2 80
$76 15 $3 05

MORE SAVINGS fOR YOUR TRUa
Slit t  Type

S A L E
P R IC E

■ fob-1b R ibH t-M iler B lackw all TT LR C  
7bO-l6 R ib  H i Miler B lackw all TT LRC  

G 7 8 - lb  Tracker LT B lackw all TL LR C  
800-16 b Tracker LT B lackw all TL LR D
8 /5 -1 6  6 Tracker J j 'B la c k w a ll  TL LR D
G 78-T5 T racker XG Bjackw all^^^LF^

S J1 .0 0  
$69 85 
$58 25 
$69.85 
|7 3 7 5  
$80 75

lift, np 
itaSt iwtStP

—

R A D IA L Sm f IN G S!Poivstoel Radial

a  AIM r u F C K - l l  we se llo u t ot your su e  we wit; issue you 
a r ainc^tefk assuring future delivery at the advertised price

p rss POP 13 «nil« «»I'

Custom Polystool
. . .  t h e  t i r e  t h a t  k e e p s  i t s  
f e e t ,  e v e n  in  t h e  r a i n .

P 1 ‘'5 '8 0 B 1 3  f its  so m e  m o d e ls  of 
Toyo ta  A u d i. VW  M azd a , C h e v e tte  
D a tsu n  F ia t  H o n d a  O m n ^ TTo re_

BUSINESSES ■  ,ie

OFFICE SPACE 
FOR RENT OR PURCHASE

It s  N. Seaman, Eastland 
Coll 629-8841 
or 647-3022

Secretarial A Talaplioiia Answaring 
Servica Avolobla

THOMPSON'S 
USED CARS AND 

EQUIPMENT
Phon« 442-1961, Doy or Night 

At 1-20 I  Hwy 113 Otco
C A R S

PICKIPS
ir »  Chevrokt DieBel Pk-knp

ItN Chevrolet du mp truck.
Good Selection of New Ford pickups and cars. We yiill 
give yon a good price for your used can as a trade-ia. 

U4 International diesel. 3 point hookup.
Maaaey Ferguson Track Loader 
I83B Case Diesel Farm Tractor 
4M latemational Diesel 
•6 Massey Fergnsoo Diesel .
*• Massey Ferguson Diesel with Front End Londer 

PTOSluft
N-AA Ford witb Front End Loader 
S-MI John Deere Grain Drills 
S-MIB Jolu Ooere Grain Drills 

Good selcetioa of shredden. blades, chisels, plaaters 
and other related farm e^nlpment.
S aaed fRoJpaient trallen in stech. 

bl4 John Deer tandem dlact
" 4ND I/KW AT WHAT WE HAVE

R es id e n tia l and i iiiiim cr-  
c ia l. Rem od eling , ad-nns, 
fo i ir r c lc  w ork , ii iw  huincs. 
c lcc tr ir  a l w ork . c i r .  Mu kc> 
W illia m s 65;{-37:i5. T (

W I U | ;  \  \ l . 1 ' i d  s s
.SalfN iiiid  V , ! \ I , , ( iit>i|i.i i f
Im ld ii i . ;  N ew . l : \ i h a ! ! : . , .  
Kr i io ia i f  t a ll I I Is Ml 
at 5,'?i-.’ Tli:> or i f . ’-ll‘r;i,i. | i

S M K i'\ i-i \ dri \ i,
( ) l  DUN C U N F .K .M  .STO KU 
111 O ld i'ii. T e xa s  l ittle  bit of 
e3e r\th in g ' G ri'ce r ie s . F u r ­
n itu re . . Ie u e lr> . K n iv e s . 
W .itiTie.s. M exiean In i|io rt.s . 
Boriks. Too ls, I 'o js  and lots 
I'f m isc 1ICIH.S. C lica[H 'sl 
sl'O e in t ills  a rea  U e  bu> us­
ed fu rn itu re , app liances and 

'd Coin-- C a ll ii.i.l-'2'!jii TC

' i . y b T L A N D  C o u n ty  
B u i ld in g  e x p e r ie n c e d  
rem odeling , pa in ting , in su la­
tion . sto rm  w indow s .All 
types of rem odeling and new 
c o n s tru c t io n  G u a ra n te e d  
work at reasonable la te s . 
44'2-2+0« Even in g s  621L2804 
T F X

GOODYEA 
J^6AS‘SAVING 

TU N i-U r

^ 3 t
REG
$42

3 34

IV P O R  T ANO D O M E S  TIC C A R S  
& L IG H T  T R U C h S

535
536

YOUR CHOICE!
BRAKE SERVICE

^ 6 6
IM P O R T  OR  
D O M ES T IC  

C A R S

Offer Ends October 3rd

Ì M ^ ^ tomotivé
ty^STEREO - - X ' i

^ 6 9

/  W H E E L  FR O N T  D ISC  Install new Ironi brake pad 
.i d i.-su-face Iron! rotors • Install new front grease seal- 
nd pack (runt wheel bearing* • Inspect caliper:, and 
lydraulic systr'tn • Add fluid and road-test car (Doe-, not 
nciu ile  rear wheels)

OR
4 W H E E L  DRUM  Install n**w brake lining and le su iface  
ri': i.'.ar drum*. • Install new front grease ,ea ls  and repack 

! wheel t.i-arinqs • Inspect hydraulic system  add fluidlad 'e*,i r ,|.
Additional parts and serv ice e x ir .i if needed

Offer Ertds October 3rd.

S F

LUBE, 
OIL CHANGE 

 ̂ & FILTER

n o FIEG
$14

„  „  .  Chassis lube up to five
g^POlNT ourit-PUiNT m aintenance check
• UMrei^’ '"a '°n  S te e r in g  flu idUr irr luid • Battery water level • Battery cables
• Air filter .  Belts and hoses • D i f f S ? a l l e i ^
• '■'* prr-ss ,re an.i condition 'oi levei

Includes many imports and light trucks 
Please cal! for appointmen!

KRACO
Save S3 95

ik 't Welding Servite 
"Custom WekSng"

V k  Stocy yu  i  O«u^»oy
629 2874 tarivid T> 7*44«

SALE ENDS SAT

ALL-WEATHER 
BATTERY

Offer Ends October 3rd.

S U P E R  S A B R E
144 Series)Limitfd 

Quantities All 
Reduced lor clearance First Come 

First Sold Not 
available m all stores

''kWK- 
'> H t a

FREE 
INSTBLLAnON

For Group G res 2?F 24 i  ?4F 
F'ts many 4 4 6 CyuOifer U S Vade A imtort Autos 
.-.ITB V8 -

-■qned frjr . . .P  . .- ...iio miniiTiui . el< r;tncal needs 
;/ea r of the ngnt battery (or whatever you drive 

mp.-irt V.ii -.ye or RV
SALE ENDS SAT NfGHT

Just Say 'Charge If
8

Guoit, -a' RHvolvinq 
Ak .)unt

nuts eulra  ̂Classic in its. .  ___  own time
44 -.700 15,7 Reg S72 95 NOW «SB 30

S a le  E n d s  S a l Otiiar attorttd t lt t *
avillahl* at riductd prlct*

A  suM m o#
( y  } / D Y N O M O  II (39 Serie*)

39-Ü47:The wneel of today in 
'8 spoke aluminum des.gn

S a le  E n d s  S a l 
Othar iitortad siz

Reg
»66 95 39.047X

Lug Outs e«trd 14x7 
39-057X 14«7 Reg $7  ̂ gg 

NOW 157 50 
ivalltbl* it fddnod prten

See M H . Perry ter 
H O SPITALIZATIO N  

(NSURANQ= 
629-1566 0. 629-1095

. 104 N. Lamar Eastland

¡fVERISTO JIMENEZ, MGR.

U s e  a n y  ot th e s e  o th e r w a y s  to b u y  O u r  O w n  C u s to m e r  C re d it  
^ f f n e r s  C llfb ^  C ash '''^ ^  * E xp re s s  • C a rte  B la n c h e

» H O N E * «  3 6 * 3  J ° ° ' *  ^°CA^ ° ° ° ° '  '’ A R  STORE
M o n ....... ...  Fri. /.'JV  to  6.UU p .m . Sot 7 3 0  to  b :ü ü  p .m . EASTLAND

m

2
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1981 SCHCDULC
CHS Varsity

Sept. 4 Hotkell Home 8:00 p.m.
Sept. 11 Baird Away 8:00 p.m.
Sept. 18 Goldthwaite Away 8:00 p.m. 

Sept. 25 OPEN
Oct. 2 Eastland Away 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 9 Eoriy Home 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 16 Dubln Home 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 23 DeLeon Away 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 30 Bongs Home 7:30 p.m.
Nov. 6 Ranger Away 7:30 p.m.

ir  'Â Nov. 13 Son Sobo Home 7:30 p.m.
•k it Homecoming

ALL DISTRICT GAMES BEGIN AT 7:30 p.m.

Osco Junior College
Sot. Sept. 5 McMurry Cbco 7:30
Thur. Sept. 10 SMU Dallas 7:30 

Thur. Sept. 17 Texas Tech Lubbock 7:30 
Sot. Sept. 26 Ronger Breckenridge 7:30 

Thur. Oct. 1 U.T.Arlington 7:30 
Thur. Oct. 8 WTSU Canyon 5:00 
Fri. Oct. 16 TCU Ft. Worth 2:00 

Tbur. Oct. 22 Ft. Hood Qsco 7:30 
Sot. Oct. 31 NMMI Cisco 2:00

Sat. Nov. 7 NEOAM Miami, Ok.

JUNIOR VARSITY
(all games played on Thursday nights)
Sept. 3 Haskell Away 7:30 p.m.
Sept. 10 Baird Home 7:30 p.m.
Sept. 17 DeLeon Home 7:30 p.m.
Sept. 24 OPEN
Oct. 1 Eastiand Home 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 8 Early Away 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 15 Dublin Away 7:30 p.m.
Oct. 22 DeLeon Away 8:00 p.m.
Oct. 29 Bangs Away 7:30 p.m.
Nov. 5 Ranger Home 7:30 p.m.

SEV ENTH AND EIGHTH GRADE 
(all games played on Thursday nights)
Sept. 10 Baird Home

DeLeon Home 
Eastland Home
Early Away
Dublin Away
DeLeon Away
Bangs Away

Ranger Home

Sept. 17 
Oct. 1 
Oct. 8 
Oct. 15 
Oct. 22 
Oct. 29 
Nov. 5

7th 5:00 
7th 5:00 
7th 5:00 

7th 5:00 
7th 5:00 
7th 5:30 
7th 5:00 
7th 5:00

8th 0:00 
8th 6:00 
8th 6:00 
8th 6:00 
8th 6:00 
8th 6:30 
8th 6:00 I 
8th 6:00

First national Bank
(SCO, T IX A S

Member F.D.I.C.

QUICK WAY GROCERY 
DELICATESSEN & BAKERY

1104 West 8th Open 24 Hours 442-3508

CompRments of
CISCO RADIATOR SERVICE

Jim & Richard Butler 
207 East 6th 442-1547

\
m
»«

Come On Out And Join UsI 

Resteurent
l-a ««« Ok*. 1.I«  OPW" M Nnn Iwnr *W

STATE FARM INSURANCE
Eddie McMcMillan

801 Avenue D. 442-1671

CISCO FUNERAL HOME
203 West 7th 442-1503

OIL STATES RUBBER CO.
Humbletown Cisco 442-3666

KIMBROUGH FUNERAL HOME
300 West 9th 442-1211

FOR SALE

PIERCE MOTOR COMPANY
? 19 West 7th 442-1566

THE CISCO PRESS
700 Ave. D 442-2245

TED'S AND REX'S ONE STOP
HorthAve. D 442-1188 Otco

Groceries-Gos-Tires-Used Pkkups- 
Utffity TraHers-Guns-Ammo

MERLE NORMAN 
COSMETIC STUDIO

709 Ave. D Gsco 442-3113

FOR SALE
SAM SUPPLY & REYNOLDS 

MANUFAaURING CO.
Siding Windows 105 te t  8th
Col Us For Free Estknotes 442-2077

SUPER VALU
1002 Ave. D Gsco

THRIFT MART
1010 Ave. E Cisco

CITY DRUG
800 Ave. 0 442-2587 Gsco

^  M A O t S O ir S
W ESTE-RN STO R E

cnee venA*
"Look her The Nerta"

t'a Aar

Inviting You To Wtitch Al Of The Gomes ̂ 0.,..« .... SOUTHERN TV CABLE SYSTEM »______ ^
Í >p M P

;î í.*̂ i

I



BUY. SELL. TRAPE OR RENT THROUGH THE

Ihursdc^, beptember lU, IVHI

p a m « s ^ -
EveryTime

you use the 
.wont Ads

J U S T  C A L L  \
442-2244 j

Hove something to boy or sell? One 0
phone coll to us is like dioling 
our entire circulation,..person-to- 
p>erson' Ploce your Wont Ad todoy!

•  ft IB I ■ M M  I

442-R44
J -

THE CISCO PRESS
Publk-aUM N*. lises lUTMi 

^ A v e .  D Oêf^TttM A 7SU?

Sccoad (.'Um  P*mI al C'lac«. T ru a . iMdrr Act af ( oafreu
ftterrk. IfT t. PW laBed SrMfr-»«ckly TV irida> 'f aad SwmU)« 

P«M M Kn-M r 4  H n  H \  O'Brtra 
EdUar-ltacift-HerTrl Hallmark 
l-^dtlT-FaaUaad-H V O 'Bnra 
Aaaar K^lor-f^MUaad-Mtrkrlir Liadar> 
ta4MUr-fUacer-Brn>
Edltar-RlaiM  Star-KvH>a t>oa4am 
Otflcr Slafl-Uaa M rirU I 
OHlc« S(alf-Pa>r M rm il 
Office Staff-MarRarel Hallmark 
(N lk r S u n-P a liic la  Hallmark 
O ffkr SlalMMaar Hngkr»
O ffkr Siafl-kiilra Bullrr 
i  aliunaUt J  W Sltt*«B 
ProdiArtlaa S«fer>laar-Tfd Raftm  
Predwliee Ra>m(md Mc4>>
Pmdiiruaa AMt-Rayrar Mr4'a>
Ad% PrudurUan-Rrar Hill 
( am^trr O^atar-RaUiv WIUHord m o n th s 
Fra ta rr Rrt|er-Vl«la Pavar 
i'am aierria l Prtatlaf-Hala Uiiaaoa

CISCO-EASTLAND-
RANGER

S U B S C R I P T I O N  
RATERS: City and in 
county 113.00. Out of 
county and out of state 
$16.00. $1.25 by the

TU M e i n s t

TE X A S  PRESS ASSOCIATION
1
NOTICE: Unless yov have estoblshed credit 

! with the Cisco Press oN classified ods most 
be poyed in advonce.

IMPORTANT 
Check your ad the 

First Day it appears. In 
event of errors, please 
ra il im m ediately to 
have it corrected. No 
claims will be allowed 
for more than one incor­
rect insertion.

The publishers liabili­
ty shall be limited to on­
ly the amount of space 
consumed by these er­
rors.

DOZF.R SF.RVICF. 
Tanking, brush pushing I 
and all types of dirt I 
work. $33 per hour. Call 
Bob Hallmark. 442-2127. 
I t̂ic

cNOTICE D
FRESH doughnuts, cin­
nam on ro lls , tw ists . 
Delivered to Cisco home or 
office Tuesdays through 
Saturday. Deliveries bet­
ween 11:00 a m. and 12:00 
a m. Call 629-2002 a day 
ahead. Tfn

NOTICE; Dallas Morning 
News, home delivery, one- 
third off rack price. Save 
with food coupons. Call 
442-1179, Glenda Petree 
p-tfc

STEVE COZART 
CONSTRLtTfON 

Remodeling 
Add-ons 

New Homes 
Cabinet 

Concrete 
Electrical, etc. 
Free estimates 

Phone 442-1709. p-41tfc

SAW SHARPENING 
SERVICE

Scissors, hand saws, tin 
snips, circular saws, 
chain saws, lawn mower 
blades. R.B. Boyd. 1602 
Ave. H, Cisco, p-tfc

C arpentry and Con­
s tru c tio n  Work. 
Residential and com- 
m errial. Remodeling, 
add-ons, new homes, 
custom cabinets, con­
crete, electrical work, 
e tc . HOLLIS
WILLIAMS, 442-1933. 
p-58tfr

In ONE FAMILY Out 
OF 5. MOTHER Gets a i 
JOB To Help PAY For a 
CHILD S LNIVERSITY 
EDUCATION. LIFE IN­
SURANCE Can Help 
AVOID THUS!

^ I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I I M I I I I I I M I I I I l l l i i .
r  SISTER TORAH = 
= Christie Palm and card :  
= reading. G uaranteed § 
E satisfaction. For ap- E 
I  pointment call 725-06M. i  
= H 7 EhiiMimiiMiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiimR

CARPtNTRYlI
Remodeling I

£

Repairs 

442-4090

Anything done around ^ 
the house. Painting, 
carpentry work, con 
Crete work, small 
bing, etc. Call 442 
p-JJtfc

«»¿vusssesnsesK;
"Ffeeman Draper Custom 
Dra pes for one window or for 
the whole house For more 
information call 725-6684 
44-i,TP

f^usTOM oim HxT
PAINTING

1'ank batteries, pump I 
jacks, and rigs. Call 
P ip p en  Pomp J a rk  
fialea, 442-1245, Highway | 
IN West, Ctieo. p-40tfc

D&P AUTO SALES 
Highway 80 West 

E asy financing-no 
credit check. We buy & 
sell used cars. Also 
AUTO REPA IR & 
PAINTING. 442-1245; 
night 442-1385. We Ap­
preciate Your Business, 
p-tfc

FONTAINE 
APARTMENTS 

Now leasing, one 
and two bedroom. 
215 West 8th. Call 
442-3661 after 5 

24tfc
p.m.

6
NOTICE

For your aluminum storm 
windows, doors, screens, 
window awnings and car­
ports. Call Otis Coleman, 
629-1644

MOBILE HOME PARK 1 
One acre spaces, lots of| 
tree s-g a rd en  space. 
Call Mary Youvonnel 
McMillan. Real Estate! 
Broker, 442-3846. p-4tfc

NOTICE: F o r home
delivery of the Abilene 
Reporter News! If you live 
north of 8th Street or west of 
Avenue N ca ll L aura 
Hamilton, 442-4007. p-tfc

DIA.MOND DIRECT started 
new company giving better 
chance to d istribu to rs. 
Rreak-away $2000 level. 20% 
not 3% retirement and other 
bonuses. Finest household, 
co m m erc ia l, cosm etic , 
vitamin. Sending informa- 
Uon (817 ) 466-3563. p-79

Notice:
Ijind Development .Service 
(1) Land CT,eaning. (2) 
Farm and Ranch Improve- 
im-nl, (31 Tcaraeiiig, (4) 
Other Improvements. F.x- 
p e rien ced  B ulldozer 
Operator. Further informa­
tion, call after 6 p.m. (817) 
629-2058 T-73

ST (TjtlR  
FUltNUT HE 

REFINISHERS 
Furniture redone 

and some for sale. 
1008 Ave. D 

Cisco, Texas 
442-3343 

p-73

CISCO T.V.
T.V. and Antenna Ser­
vice. Call R ichard  
R iggs, 442-2622 or 
442-3106. p-74

i  ^f  NOTICE j<
j  Carpentry and painting. 5 
S Call 442-3933. p-77 5

PIANO IN STORAGE 
Beautiful spinet-console 

stored locally. Reported like 
new. Responsible party can 
take at big saving on low 
paym ent balance. Write 
Joplin Piano, Inc., Joplin, 
Missouri 64801. Include 
home phone number, p-74

NOTICE: Own your own 
Jean Shop. Offering all the 
nationally known brands 
such as Jordache, Vander­
b ilt, C alvin K lein, 
Sedgefield, Î evi and over 70 
other brands $12,300.00 in­
cludes beginning inventory, 
airfare for one to the apparel 
center, training, fixture.^ and 
grand opening promotions. 
Call Mr. Loughlin at 
M adem oiselle Fashions, 
612-835-1304 p-73

w s

$100 REWARD for safe 
return of our dog, strayed 
from home about 2 weeks 
ago. I^arge, solid black male 
l,abrador Retriever, has on­
ly one eye. Responds to 
name of Albert Webb, 
817-643-8144 . 2 mi. S. of Ris­
ing Star. 35-ltc

PARTTIME CASHIER for 3 
to 11 Friday and Saturday 
nights. Taylor Center 805 W. 
Mam. Tnf

YARD WORK: Light 
and heavy hauling. All 
tree work. Call 442-3869 
or 442-4098. p-52tfo

IRONING WANTED: $6 
dozen. Call 442-1753, Cisco. 
p-75

HELP WANTED 
Mature cashier. Apply 
in person al Taylor 
Center, 100 Ave. D, 
Cisco. p-43tfc

n

WANTED: Man to learn 
about oilfield chemicals. 
Part time or full time. Call 
817-653-2268. T-73

1
WANTED

I Custom Plowing. Day 
! work. Hauling. Call 
I 44M928. p40

WELDERS NEEDED: Top 
pay, all company benefits. 
Contact Lone Star Head Co., 
Albany, Texas, Bobby or 
Randy McCoy, 915-762-3380. 
p-75

WANTED: Would like a 
couple, prefer middle aged 
to work together on 11 to 7 
shift. For more information 
call 442-3508. p-73tfc

WANTED: Would like to 
lease farm land in Cisco area 
for wheat production. (Dali 
442-1928. p-73

MOVING SALE: Saturday, 
Sept. 12. 402 West 5th, Cisco 
Carpet, wall furnishings, 
dishes, girl’s clothes sizes 
2-8, some toys, bicycle and 
some furniture, p-73

THREE FAMILY YARD 
SALE: Friday, 8:30 to 5:30. 
609 West 3rd, Cisco. Weather 
permitting. Shotgun, fur­
niture, antique bath tub, ex­
ercise bicycle, toys, lots of 
girls and boys clothes size 4-8 
and boys teen size, all in 
good co n d itio n , ad u lt 
clothes, swing set, pre-hung 
door unit, and lots of odds 
and ends. We've cleaned the 
storage sheds, p-73

SIX FAMILY GARAGE 
SALE: 400 West 10th, Cisco. 
Monday, Sept. 14 and Tues­
day, Sept. 15, from 7 a.m. to 6 
p.m. L^ts of nice clothes, 
children’s, teen, men’s and 
women's, beauty supplies, 
coats, mattress and springs, 
end tables, vacuum cleaner, 
ty p e w rite r , d ish es. 
Something for everyone, p-73

GARAGE SALE: Doors, 
clothes some new, dishes, 
pots and pans, Christmas 
decorations, furniture and 
lots of junk. Seven miles on 
Scranton Road, on left, new 
red and white brick house. 
Friday afternoon, Saturday 
and Sunday, p-74

GARAGE SALE: Friday 
Sept. 11, 2 p.m. till 7 p.m., 
Saturday, Sept. 12, 8 a.m. till 
5 p.m. Comer of Avenue D 
and West 8th Street. Cisco 
Old Mott’s building. SPON­
SORED BY KIWANIS 
CLUB, p-74

CARD )
MOBILE HOME 
SPACE FOR LEASE: 

^One acre tract. 442-3330. 
p-4tfc

HOUSE FOR RENT: 704 
E ast 12th, Cisco. Call 
559-5257, Breckenridge. p-74

FOR RENT: 2 bedroom 
house, fu rn ish ed . $140 
month. Water paid, prefer 
married couple. No pets or 
children. Call 442-2096. p-73

MINI WAREHOUSE! 
STORAGE as low as $201 
month. Call 442-3340,] 
Cisco. p-57tfc

M O N U M i N T S

WORKS
LOYAL & DORIS LUNDSTROM - OWNER

442-9995CURBING 
LAST DATES 
708 E 8th CISCO JEX.

HARGRAVE INSURANCE 
AGENCY

1106Ave.D 
Cisco, Tex

Personal Soles 8 Service For
— NOME Insurance
— Car Iniuronce
— Commerciol Business Insurance
» MobSe Home Insurance & Travel Trailers
— Boot Insurance 

Life Insurance
— Bondi Of AN Kinds

Shirley A. Hargrove 
442-1477 Or 442 1059

FOR SALE: Hybrid Sudan 
hay, $2.00 per bale in stack. 
Also one used comet $150. 
Call 442-1481. p-73

FOR SALE: Small Hon­
da Express motorcycle, 
two baskets on rear and 
one on front. Ideal for 
student going to school 
or housewife. Excellent 
rondition, autom atic 
starter. Priced for quirk | 
sa le . Call 442-1300, 
Cisco, p-79

FOR SALE: China sink 
with aluminum legs, wall 
heater, mirrowed cabinet. 
Call 442-1000. p-73

IX)TS FOR SALE: 12 lots on 
College H ill. Call 
1-915-381-5804 after 6 p.m. 
p-73

BUNDY comet for sale. Us­
ed 3 yrs. $150 643-2388. 34-2tc

FOR SALE: 4 piece 
bookcase bedroom suite 
$100 or 3 piece $75. Spr­
ings included. See after 
1:00 p.m. 1310 Bullard, 
Cisco, p-78

FOR SALE: 1974 Harlex 
1200, pay off note at 
bank. See at 1007 Ave. B, 
Cisco, after 5:30 p.m. 
p-75

FOR SALE: 1975 BMW 
900 motorcycle, 10,000 
miles, fairing, luggage, 
clean. See Wayne West, 
442-1588 or 442-2652 after 
5 p.m. p-77

or THANKS _
I wish to thank all the peo­

ple that were so kind to me 
during my stay in the 
hospital. Thank you for your 
cards and flowers, and most 
of all your prayers. 'Thanks 
to the doctors and nurses for 
their kindness and good 
care. God bless you all.

Fannie Townsend

CARD OF THANKS
The family of H.A. Bible 

wishes to express our thanks 
and appreciation to friends 
and neighbors for their 
prayers and expressions of 
concern during his hospital 
stay. To the nurses and doc­
tors for their unlimited 
assistance and loving care, 
our sincere gratitude.

FOR RENT OR LEASE: 
Cisco-Rising Star area, two 
bedroom house with use of 
pasture land. Handy man 
can work for part rent. Call 
214-272-2637 after 5 p.m. and 
weekends. 34-1 tc

FOR SALE: Hogs. 
Registered Duroc. Gilt 
and boar. Call H.T. Sut­
ton after 5 p.m. at 
647-1026.

The Cisco Pressi

(REAL ESTATE

Here it is, just outside the 
City limits of Cisco, exciting­
ly beautiful dwelling, sur­
rounded by five (5) acres of 
good land, paved road, city 
water plus well, you will like 
it, best of all you can buy it. 
Also one of the nicest brick 
dwellings in Cisco, best of 
locations and price is not ex­
orbitant. We have a place to 
fit your need and your 
pocketbook. GARL D. GORR 
REAL ESTATE
BROKERAGE. p69tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroorrT 
home with life time vinyl 
siding, all paneled, carpet 
and drapes, dishwasher and 
garbage disposal, 2‘z lots 
with good water well, 2 
storage buildings, 2 air- 
conditionets, and pool table 
included. 508 East 8th, Cross 
Plains, 725-6648 or 725-7311. 
p-«2tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3
bedroom, p 4 bath, 2,000 ,sq. 
ft., corner lot, FHA approv­
ed. Equity and assume 9*2% 
loan. Call 442-1245 or 442-1585 
after 7:00 p.m. p-42tfc

SUPER BUY!
T otally  rem odeled  3 
bedroom, 2 bath, 2 lots, 
closets and built-ins galore, 
storm  windows, central 
heat, pecan trees, carpeted, 
fenced, garage and storage. 
Call 442-3233. p-73

FOR SALE: Commer­
cial building across 
street from Bank. About 
40’ X 100’ sales floor, two 
rest rooms, four office 
room s, vau lt, a ttic  
storage space. 713 Ave. 
D, lx>ne Star Gas office 
building. Call 44M588 or 
see Wayne West, ?-69tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE OR | 
TRADE: Nice 3
bedroom in Cisco, cor­
ner lot, ideal for school I 
and churches, ready to I 
live in. Owner will carrv I 
some paper or trade for i 
land, travel trailer, cat-1 
tie, etc. Call 44^.1017.| 
p-78

Six room frame dwelling, livable condltfon, extra 
ground, good neighborhood, owner financing.

Attractive, beautiful Inside, four large rooms, dwell­
ing sits In good part of town and owner financing.

Six room frame dwelling ready to move in, finest of 
locations and on paved street.

Choice three bedroom two bath brick, beautiful yard, 
paved street and owner financing. You may own the 
finest at no extra charge.

Anyone would be proud to own this one, three 
bedroom, two bath, brick v,, comer lot, paved street, 
beautiful yard and in the best part of town.

Another two story frame, very attractive upstairs 
nnri down, paved street and very good location.

Roomy five room frame, good location and worth the 
money.

Five room dwelling, nice fenced back yard, comer 
lot good part of town.

Roomy four bedroom, 2 bath brick, very attractive 
interior, nine rooms total, location adequate for com­
bination business and dwelling or either. Owner financ­
ing.

Very desirable country property with dwelling or 
without.

Solid medium priced houses, some with ready finan­
cing.

Some real buys In commercial buildings, vacant lots 
you name it we could have it.

Dwelling on Avenue D in commercial district will 
make home or business.

807 Ave. D., Gsco
Garl D. Gorr 

Real Estate Brokerage
Three salesmen to assist in a l phoses 

I of the work. 442 3642 or, night 44M642

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
506 West 7th, Cisco. Living 
room, dining room, kitchen, 
lots of cabinets, 2 bdrms., 1̂ « 
bath, utility room. Call 
442-2211 day or 629-1027, 
nights. |25,0()0. p-56tfc

FOR SALE: 2 large lote. 
Just off Ave. D and 1-20. 
Inquire at 701 East 14U*. 
Cisco, p-76

Need a cabin...or a permanent home...on I.ake Cisco? 
You’ll like this North Lake Shore Drive 2 story water 
front home. Priced low 30’s includes furniture. Owner 
carry. Call today Corine Ingram, RE/MAX Realtors, 
Abilene, office (915 ) 698-4440, home (915 ) 554-7767. p-78

D NEED ROOM?

2 LARGE BRICK BUSINESS BUILDINGS 
Facing On Ave. D In Cisco

lK.t.4  M Cnc'i mwir Itrttt .t ih. iwrDi Mid •( Km diitrict
»«r Ifc« MigioMl CmhW HItM N.ttI aU Osca Jr. Cab«c

BUILDINGS ABOUT 50 X 100 AND 25 X 110 
WITH PAVED A llET  BETWEEN

SO' X !(»' kiMn« Im aHk« Knit tk* front mO
nil rMmi. Tk. mnaindtr h cImt t,« .Ml Ivy* ilUkiy dMn o.mkiy 
t. Ikt outiid* Tkt "f»rior M wall b of wood ond If h colod Ikroô ovf

H X IIS' kuddkiy koi drioo ki doort ond romyt.

IDEAL FDR RETAIL, INDUSTRIAL, AND RECREATIONAL USES, 
INCLUDING WAREHOUSES AND GARAGES

■uddnsi to ko told toyoflior o> a kockiyo 

Wrfit.̂ lit<oit>i Mdioti. •«« n. UiSni luitZiMt._______

JO it ,S/A -
507 West 5th. 3 bedroom with pretty kitchen, central” 

heat and air, and fenced yard. $35,500. Assume 12% 
loan with $12,000 down.

806 West 13th. 2 bedrooms, 2 lots, 80% financing 
po.ssible. $22,000

1004 West 11th. Neat 2 bedroom home, ready to live 
in. Storage, carport, trees. $27,500.

605 West 11th. 2 bedroom home with fenced yard. 
Priced to leave you with fixing up money. $13,000.

WE NEED USTINGS 

AIJUOST SOIX) OUT 

I£ T  US SELL YOURS TOO

^ I t a  Webb, Associate, 442-3546 
Ray Moody, Broker, 725-7279

!*-i2  fin < /  / - . f  , 44<>n.-i9u.

V  r

>4̂ d>e#e’.
Mr.



CURHSMT R EA L
ESTA TE & I

flTTR erioA/s
EQUAL HOUSING 
OPPORTUNITY

All real estate advertising i. 
this newspaper is subiectto the 
Federal Fair Housing Act of 
1968 which makes it illegal to 
advertise "any preference, 
limitation or discrimination 
Dased on race color, religion, 
set or national origin, or an in­
tention to make any such pre­
ference, kmitaticn or discrimi­
nation "

This newspaper will not 
knowingly accept any advertis­
ing tor real estate which is m 
violation of the law Our read­
ers are hereby mtormed that all 
dwellings adverhsed in this 
newspaper are available on an 
equal opportunity basis

Sunday, September 6, 1V81

HOMES
•2 Bd.
•Great commercial location on 0th Street Cisco, with large corner lot and 2 bd. house, 

with garage, owner will carry at 12% with $8,000 down.
•4  Bd., 2 both home on large corner lot buy equity K assume low interest loon.
•2  Bd, 1 both double carport on 3 acres V.A. ready.
•Assum e good interest note, poyments under *300“® per month, 14X80 3 bd. mobile 

home on 2 50X150 lot storage building, too. *7,500 equity 
• ‘6.000 Down & owner cSOLD I 12% 2 bd. close to town. Or. HHA/VA.
• 3 Lots and small house, *15,000.

LAKE HOMES
R •O bd. oil the extras SOLOAmer will finance at low interest

•REDUCED 1 bd, fireplace, private cove, only *13,500. Low down & owner corry.
•1  bd. nice dock, 2 beautiful lots, *24,000.
• 3  Bd cobin Southside fix up only »11,500.
•Beautiful 2 Bd, 2 both home, water front, bootdocK and boot house patios, terraced, 

workshop
PLUS

*2 Bd. cabin complete with root deck, patio, and furniture.
ACREAG E

•160 oc. ronch, complete set of steel pens, and small home.
•320 oc. 1-20 frontage, invesiina>in opponurmy, some minerals, good water 
•179 oc. cottier ranch 12 mi South of Breckenridge 3 bd. Central H/A lovely hoiite.

Good Hunting, some minerals 
•160 oc with 40 oc in pecans, some minerals.
»330 oc. Vt minerals, 150 acres in popershell poco Price Reduced 
•7 acres with good fences and metal shop only *12,500.
• 8  Acres in coastal with 4 bedroom home, some owner finance.
•116 oc. near Cross Plois. This is o working form with postures, garden spot, fruit tree: 

cultivated fie lds,^ elIs, steel fences, workshop, and tractor shed. Beautiful 2 bd.
2 both, wood stove patio, and lots of shade trees.
15 Qc. & 3 bd. house moved to site. Lovely country south of Cisco.

LG  )
• i7 7  X 110' on paved street in desirable spot *16,000.

IbM » Do Nat Rmnrwtani All Our Ui finos. Call Us For More informaUnn
Dana Goosen, Broker a  a - ', - j . n o  Penny Reay

(817) 442-3958 ( o l ' j  4 4 2 - I 6 t3 (817) 442-1707

B u y A  U se d  H o m e?
Once you have decid­

ed to buy a home and 
how much you are will­
ing to pay for it, you 
still have to decide

whether or not to buy a 
new or older house.

Compared to a new 
house of the same size.

condition, a previously 
owned home generally 
will cost less. It will be 
located in an establish­
ed area where the

• k ir k i tk i t i t

* Lone Star Title t 
& Abstract Co.

Joe B. loonee, Mfr.
101 W. Htln I

Eastlind, Texu 76448 |

4
4
.4
4
4
4

z * ™

Oil Is Where You Find It...

......so sayeth the oilmen. So is love, happiness, success and all of the
other elements that make up our lives. Where do you go to find title in­
formation? Not on the street corner or the barber shop or any other 
place except in an abstract office. Yes, we have it, compiled, indexed 
and assembled daily, from the very beginning down to the present 
time, plus years of experience and training. Visit us soon and let us 
have an opportunity to serve you.

Easthmd County Abstract Company 
Pat And AnnoHo Miller

Abftrocts and Fitte mturance

c h a ra c te r  of the 
neighborhood is ap­
parent, and it will have 
an established yard 
with trees and shrubs.

A preowned home 
may be lacking in cer­
tain critical items, 
however, and could re- 
q u ire  m ore
maintenance than a 
new one. For example, 
adequate insulation is 
not found in many 
homes more than 10 
years old. Some older 
homes do not have ade­
quate electrical wiring 
to hand le  to d ay ’s 
arsenal of household 
appliances.

Remember, as with 
any large investment, 
there are risks and 
rewards involved in 
buying a home-old or 
new.

RESiPENTlAi
OLDER 2 story house near school in Carbon. Large lot 
with plenty of room for gardening. Needs repair. Budget 
priced. __
SPACIOUS HOME ON 2 LOTS-4 bedrooms, 1^ baths, ful­
ly carpeted, custom kitchen with built-ins, energy saving 
storm windows. Covered patio faces large, fenced back 
yard. Near schools. See this one soon!
A LITTLE BIT OF HISTORY: One of the oldest homes 
in Palo Pinto County, moved from Thurber to present 
site in Strawn in early 1900’s. Restorable condition. On 
200' X140’ lot, and price includes 197514 x 80 total electric 
completely furnished mobile home. Price reduced! 
PLENTY OF ROOM: This three Itedroom or could beToilf 
bedroom, 1 Y« bath home on comer lot. Assumable financ­
ing with 1190 monthly payment. Owner said trade for 
an^hinjg of value for his equity.
ThEAl, WEfcR-END EAT, or year-arouA?
residence. A ttra e t ju g e S j^  .lied 2 bedroom, 1 bath 
home on large d eev p ^ ^ T ^ A K E  LEON. Many extras in­
cluded.

COZY 2 br, 1 bath c-.npieiei> i<.i>ivAlelied mside, new 
carpet, on shaded lot, located in Ranger. Bud«»*** 
60KMAN: lueai for retired or siium ..a s  nice «
beArtem with separate uUlity sits on two lots with large 
garden area. Elxcellent condition, weU insulated. City 
utilities and weU for garden use. Reasonably priced. 
OWNER MUST SELL-Equity lowered - Lake Cisco: Love­
ly South side home o n n e n t  only 4H miles from 
downtown. Two fireplace, central
H/A, glassed sun opens to wooden deck, beautiful 
yieWjJenced yard. Numerous extras. CaU for details. 
RENTAL PROPERTY - 3 bedroom 1 bath home on large* 
lot. $12,500.00

' w í!íír
Q o U tftry " RlAl ISTATl

629-1725 l= r

PRICE DRASTICALLY REDUCED Invest your money ir. 
duplexes and have a hedge against inflation while you en­
joy the tax advantages of rental property. We have two 
d i^ ex  units, brick, buittins, carpet, carports, 100% oc- 
cupancy. Inquire today.
AMAlJ. ACREAGE with 3 q c ^ .d ro o m  Older home in»¿SU»
carport and storage areaw..j(i't miss this opportunity for
good condition, garden i rees, water weU, huge

country living at a reasonable price.
: uveuta tot Approx. 30u ft. road frontage. 

Approx. «5 f* »sferfrtug. wUlow Baach subdivision, old!

imM E COMPLETED on 2V4 ac. with Oku k« 
WSO. 1*10 aq. f* Snr»»« total alootrto 
OMsalal Myls Brick you wlU lu^e me arrangement oi 

well-kept home in one of Ranger’s

 ̂ E
FM*:»* COMVEMnqittf HNANCmo

established neighborhoods for formal or informal 
entertaining. Features like Uving room with custom 
drapes, and formal dining area, den with fireplace, 
breakfast area off kitchen, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths. Patio 
yard is privacy fenced. Garden area and dog run 
separately fenced. Outside storage bldg. By appoint­
ment.
Op p o r t u n it y  k n o c k s ! Take advantage of this offer­
ing of income producing property consisting of four units 
AU have maintenance-free metal siding, and all conve 
niently located m  ISO x 150 ft. lot only 4  block from his 
'school. OR, live in the spacious,~comfoltable, recent) 
remodelled, 3 bedroom, 2 tath , LR, den w/fireplace, bui! 
ins, central heat anH •»- -«h let 3 rentals help make yo' 
pajrments^
OWNER HAS MOVED! We are looking tor a tamUy wh< 
needs over 1600 aq. ft. 3 bedrooms, 1 bath on corner lot 
shadsiL by huge trees, with exceUent garden space. 
Recently remodeUed, with almost new range and 
refrigerator. Separate utility room with space for ironing, 
sewing. Don't wait Call us todav!

WE WANT TOUR
ipMUTi sw afkniu

RARBAtA lOVE, BROKER omRTuames
COMPLETELY R Em JD EI£D  - 2 bedroon . ith cr 
port and storage room in Eastland. Perfect for the 
small family.
IDEAL.L.Y loealed on comer lot, close to schools, this com­
fortable, recently remodelled home offers 3 bedroom, 2 
baths, living room, den with fireplace and all new kitchen, 
'en tra ' h*>at and air. Reasonably priced.

COMMERCIAL PROPERH
RISl îU st a r  - Large commercial/shop uuiiaing loLateof 
downtown area. REASONABLE, and you convert to your
nffrr» r/vor*«*
BRICK BUILDING with 20 x 25 ft. office on several lota i 
Gorman. Excellent for garage or small factory.

ACREAGE
9 ACRES M / l  u iu / 8/TU n u ie  est of Ranger City 
Limits. All cleared, county road two sides. $2,000.00 
down owner finance balance on contract for deed. 
Af'RES Oi oak trees (s the setting for this Luge oricx

y OU ARE OUR BUSINESS
MAKBAKA iOTI 64#«I197

Eoftland, Tax««

liome with 3 bedroom, 2V6 (wUis, separate dining room 
and living room. Lived in only 2 years. Good water well, 2 
septic tanks, total electric. Located near Gorman.
53 ACRES convenier* ♦“ ^-^* ind . All cleared with scat­
tered trees. Water a SOLD County Road. WUl divide 
for Texas Vet. with papers.
60 ACRES So. of Cisco, 1 mile off Hwy. 206. Approx. 30 
acres coastal, 15 acres love grass, some timber. One good 
stock tank, shallow hand-dug well.
66 ACREIS with large 2 bedroom home, city water and 
well, located on Hwy. 69. Convenient to Elastland, Cisco, 
Ranger, Breckenridge. Approx. 36 acres pasture, 30 acre 
field, 3 stock tanks, roping pen, barr 
79 ACRES sandy land ( M l  |u  tai, mostly cleared, good I 
fences, at Olden. WUl » V l i l«
10 ACRES near Eastland. All cleared. About W mUe off 
Hwy. 69.
Í1965 acres in Gty Limits with mobile home hooxup, cit' 
water. Cleared, fenced, some large pecan trees.
60 ACRES, 26 acres peanut allotment, 1 water weU, s^:idy] 
loam, south of Cisco. Approx. 1 mUe off pavement. 
HORSE LOVERS • You must see this 120 acres with large 
completely remodelled rock home. This place is set up for I 
convenience of horse breeders and safety fenced to p ro -'  
tect your investment in your animals. 6 large sheds, I 
numerous corrals, 3 water meters, 2 mobUe homes, 
peanut aUotment, V4 minerals, 4 stock tanks, cross-1 
fenced, coastal and native grasses. CARBON AREA 
63.5 Acres near Eastland with frontage on blacktop.
One tank and old well. Part wooded, good deer and 
turkey hunting. WUl divide for "Texas 

^Vet. with papers in h ^ d .
12.642 ACRES on FM 2M1 near Lake Leon Dam Blacktbf) 
.rantage^ staff water. Permanent easement to lake. CaU 
lodaj;
150 aGRES with 3 BR home. Some improved grasses, twi 
irrigation weUs. Fronts on paved highway South of CÍsc> 
Owner,wUl help finance.
BUILD your dream house on one of these 2 to a,.
Tacts. Located on Hwy 6, 5 mUes S. of MaafianH ’ ctt> 
Zkter available
1 ACRES with beautiful a bedroom,  ̂ .^u i a yr, old bric< 
ome. Horse pens, 3 stock tanks, 25 ,.cres in coastal, goooi 
epees. Located 4 miles of jOonnap 
8 acres, m/1 approx. * ̂ ' e s  S oM E aauand oi. .iw /. o 

Highway frontage^ cA y ^ ared . 25% down and owne» 
finance balance. Cv^rSoon.
8V4 ACRES with new large 2800 sq. ft., 3 bedroom, 2 fuL 
baths, famUy room, separate utility. Only 3 nMntlis old. 
Plenty of trees. Just outside the d ty  Umita of Ciorman. 
Price reduced for ouirk sale
26 ACRES approximately 3 miles west of G ‘«rail l isa . uo-O, 

t^w ate rc jn  be arranged. Some minerals___________

j



FM  SALE: 3 iMdnwffl, 1 b d k  
Ininf room and dinin| room. Wll 

fiNMCt FHA. Call attor (  p̂ m. 

M M 3 U .  TF

HOUSE FOR SALE: 
Assume loan, low equity, 
central air and heat. 929 
Vitalious Ranger. TFN

Sunday, S«ptemb«r 6, 1981

steel Sldliig>8aleti 
And Installatioo 

A-1 Sales
7M W. Maln-Eastland 
Call Anytime fiZ9-Z102

IT-C,

realtor;
Fquol Housing 
OpporiunitíMNtlM Bradford, Brokor 

Bon Pvrock, AtMdote
Moin Offico-205 Eott Mdn-Ro^r, Texas 647-3230 
Broncli Offico-116 North Soomon-Eostlond, Texos 629-8641

LAKE HOUSE- Deeded lot with staff water. 287' froiv
tage & 300' deep. House has all rrew plumbing, new 
carpet, new curtains & shades, new TV antenna & 
booster. Kitchen newly painted, Ben Franklin wood 
stove, large storage shed with porch. 250 gal. butane » 

rtank, 70% full of fuel. Lots of big shade trees Price 
^226.600.00
^  BUSINESS • In Ranger • Call for details.

^  BUSINESS • Station, garage doing good business, buy 
^ equip and inv. - Rent Building.
^ IDEAL FOR ANY TYPE BUSINF,SS: Api 1350 sq. ft. 
\  for office space or other business. Lot .614 A. on Hwy 
| « W .

t
NEED RENT PROPERTY? 2 bdr., 1 bath frame house 
on big lot located in Strawn, Texas. $8,500.00

GRUTBUY
Ideal property for oil field supply, drilling co., or truck­
ing CO. 5000 aq. ft. metal 3 story building - total usable 
sq. f t  all 3 stones 12,000 sq. ft. Completely fenced - 
metal fence includes parts dept., garage, 2 offices.

Additional metal building 1600 sq. ft. 2 bath A/C in­
sulation • asphalt parking area - all for 160,000 With 
terms.

THIS ONE WILL MAKE MONEY& 2 bdr., 1 bath 
frame on 1 lot located on Howsley St. in Strawn, Texas. 
Some carpet. Now rented for $130 00 mo. Priced at only 
$9,000.00
HOUSES TO BE MOVED! 3 Br., LR. kitchen. 1 bath, 
good solid frame. 2 BR, 1 bath, comb. IJI & DR. Priced 
to sell quick.
LAND • 22 A. Close In - Call for details.

LAND ■ Enjoy hunting? 35.5 A. Post Oak - No Minerals 
15 M. SE of Cisco. Wild turkey and deer. Fenced on (3) 
sides - Next to Game Preserve.

160 ACRES OF BLACK LAND-Cleared, good tank, 
good fences, kline f j  ^  grass
on 13 acres. City w a ^ ^ r ii la b le ,  good grass, some of 
the best land in Stephens County! W minerals goes with 
place. Excellent bird hunting! Will sell all or would 
divide.

IDEAL Hwy. 80 E. Business property! 2 A. with house 
and shop building. I^ots of highway frontage.

PECAN AND FRUIT TREES will help make payments 
on this 6 4  A.-Appx. 1900 sq. ft. in House. Double car 
port it patio. Good Buy!

HOUSE FOR SALE BY 
OWNER: 3 bedroom, living 
room, dining room, kitchen, 
bath, washer/dryer connec­
tions, utility room. Paneled, 
carpeted. $25,000.00. Shown 
by appointment only. Call 
442-1561, Cisco. p40tfc

FOR SALE: Ideally suited 
lease lot at Lake Leon with 
200 feet waterfront; Staff 
Water; enclosed floating 
boat dock with walkway. 
Rugged, secluded, good 
roads, and convenient. Close 
to Country Club. 629-2413. TF

FOR SALE 
OR LEASE 

SO by 100 ft. brick 
building on Ave. D, 
Cisco. Office front; 
loading doors rear; 
rest rooms; dear- 
span interior. Call 

629-1707 or 629-2413.

By Owner; Shady corner 
lot, 3 bdrm, newly remodel­
ed, privacy fence, Spanish 
Style structure. 602 South 
Daugherty. Owner carrying 
som e financing . Phone 
629-1461 for
appointment T-tnf

FOR SALE: 3 lots on bik. 4, 
Burkett addition. Pho. 629- 
2183. T-C
f rwMWWwrFVOowwwwm

Building Or Remodelidg 
We Do It All 

A-1 Sales

705 W. Main-ta-stland 
•  Call Anytime 629-2102 
« • • • • • • • • • • • • • a «

HOUSE FOR SALE IN 
OLDEN: 2 acres with water 
well, 2 bedroom, kitchen and 
dining area, large utility 
room. $4,000 equity and 
assum e 946% loan. Call 
442-2746. p-70tfc

House For Sale 
By owner

Clean, fresh ly  pain ted , 
remodeled 3 bedrooms, 2 
baths, sunny breakfast area, 
w a llp ap e r, c a rp e t,,  
dishwasher, lots of storage, 
cen tra l a ir  conditioning, 
cedar fence, cellar, garage, 
2 lots, FHA approved $31,500 
call 647-1891, if no answer 
call 647-3027. TC

Superior Siding
FREE ESTIMATE.... .

4

Dress up your present residence 
and save .on heating and cooling 

with steel or vinyl siding with insulationj 
Replacement Windows, Storm Windows, 

and Stttrm Doors.
CALL FOR FREE ESTIMATE 

J.C. Butler 
6 2 9 - 2 1 4 9( 8 1 7 )

Ä  IIT T LE  s a v e  a  L ó t i

• I 'h i !

EASTLAND

M OBILE HQAAE SA LES
SINGLE WIDES 

DOUBLE WIDESFUA A  VA 
FINANCING

II_________

WE SERVICE 
fOUR HOME 

FOR ONE 
fYEAR AFTER 

THE SALE

irMOAHVMCWCtuJ
A 2 « - 2 I I ’1

INT ?0 O lden, Teno»

"-E SAVF

K I N C A I D  
R E A L  E S T A T E

LAKE PROPERTY
RESIDENTIAL

WHAT A BARGAIN! 2 bdrm., 1 bath. Nice comer lot. 
Large rooms, custom drapes Well kept inside and out. 
2 car carport and small fenced area. $25,000.00. It won't 
last long!

CLOSE TO DOW’ )WN--1 bdnn . 1 bath older 
frame house. Large tuoms with some improvements. 
House solidly constructed, located on extra large lot in 
nice neighborhood Has several bearing fruit trees and 
garden spot. 1 car garage. Owner will finance with one 
half down $32.500 00

ENJOY THIS HOME!-located in Carbon Three bdrm, 
1 bth, utility room. House has been redone, carpet 
throughout. Nic and private on large lot, pretty trees 
Carport St 18’ X 24' storage building. Owner would take 

LI mobile home in trade $27,000

|4  ATTENTION SINGLES-own your own home with this 1 
bdrm., 1 bath home, $1500 down and owner will finance. 
$8,500.00ft

*1 U)W DOWN PAYMK*"^
1̂ «̂ bath mobile home 

owner finance $8,.,«<.u0

on this neat 2 bedroom, 1 
n lot. Only $1.000 down and

RANGER - 3 bdrm, 1 bath comfortable home has new 
carpet, new paint. C A L O ^* ' pecan trees.
Come look! Possib.FMner finance. $25,000

^RANGER- 3 b d r m h o m e ,  central H/A, com­
pletely remodelled s ^ p e s , too. Nice location. $31,500.

IDEAL MOBILE HOME SITE - City utilities available 
on this cleared lot in Olden. 150’ x 75'. Owner finance. 

Fi $2,750.00

XOZY & CUTE - 2 bdrm. new paint and carpet Small 
f^yard. carport on paved street Nice for single or starter 

■home. $25,000

PLENTY OF ROOM - to live in and rent out this large 2 
j story apartment ^ * A t s ,  in good repair, stays 
1 rented, good neighbt great investment $27,500.

a f f o r d a b l e  LIVING-Start with this small home 2 
I or 3 bdrms., 1 bath, 12,500 Owner will finance.

RANGER- This remodeled hoi 
ft. on extra large lot. 
financing. $32,100.00.

ed house has 3 bdrms, 1400 sq. 
S O L D ^  and air. Assumable

LOT FOR SAI£-Lot a lit*» ire than half an acre set 
up for mobile homt O V O  bigger trees with a good 
garden spot. Has p . . I ^ y  too. $4,400,

10 LOTS in Ranger -1 set up for mobile home. By all 
10 for $12,000 or 5 for $7,500.

COMMERCIAL
OWN A FAMILY BUSlNESS-locally owned conve 
nience stor with gas pumps. Has good cash flow. Ownei 
will consider financing for right person. Also has 
trailer park on 3 acres. Can accommodate 21 trailers. 
Good buy. Call for information.

PRIME RAILROAD SPUR LOCATION ! building with 
office, 1400 sq. ft. floor space - dock height, 2 storage 
buidlings on 14 acres. Excellent for bulk delivery ship­
ping point. $75,000.

THRIVING BUSINESS • I.«cal business that grossed 
$740,000 in 1979 . Excellent cash flow and terrific loca­
tion. Terms negotiable.

COMMERCIAL LOC ATION- -l,arge bldg, site on N. ac­
cess of 1-20 Excellent location.. Good investment 
Owner finance, 25% down $25,000 00

EXCELLENT LOCATION -1.5 acres on Hwy. 80 near 
1-20. Unlimited potential. Older 3 bdrm. house. Call for 
more information.

DEVELOPMENT POSSIBILITIES 151 acres with 120 
frontage, paved hwy. Nemerous options. Owner finance. 
$1.000 00/acre.

SEVERAL MUIE1.S • listed in various parts of the 
state. All excellent investments. Call for location and 
details.

INVESTMENT 
house Small 2 
downstairs Washer 
$35.000

WITH RETURN 4 unit apartment 
room units upstairs, larger 2 room 

t dryer, $700 month income.

SUMMER HIDE-AW* Y
ed lot. Good fishing. A 
$11,700

IV

SOLD
Odern cabin on deed- 
;er on this one ! LL67

LAKE LDTS- We also have many lots available some 
with excellent water frontage. The fishing is good and 
the price is right. LL-01

ACREAGE

SPORTSMAN RETREAT-78.9 acres of hunting and 
fishing! 3 stocked tanks for fishing with live creek. 
Dove, quail, turkey and deer. 20 acres coastal and 13 
ac. wheat. 1 acre fenced garden. City water. Pretty 
campsite with all hook-ups. Some assumable financ­
ing. $633/acre.

93.34 ACRES in Okra area. Has good stock tank, 57 
acres cultivation, 18 acres of pretty timber. Also a 33 
acre peanut allotment. Owner will finance with 29% 
down or will Texas VET/Also will divide. Has minerals 
that will go. Great buy at $540/acre.

77 ACRES - Close to Ranger. Good pasture land, 
tank, easy access. Also good deer and turkey hunting. 
$725/Acre.

49 ACRES - in northern part of Eastland County. 
Tank has been stocked. On good County Road less than 
1 mile off pavement. $700/Acre.

42.53 ACRES <■ Oak tree^, pasture land. New tank - 
really pretty land. Come and look at it. Owner will 
finance. $685/acre.

20 ACRES - available on pa^ed highway about 4 miles 
from Eastland. All impr^«k5^oastal bermuda, 1 tank, 
few trees, good fe n c e c f i^ ib le  owner finance. Will 
Tex. Vet. $15,000 ^

124 ACRES - Pecan orchard at Carbon, about 70 pro­
ducing trees, city w ^ t e ^ - ^  tank for a mobile home, 
all on paved hiway Owner financed at
16% interest. $25.000.

39.29 A C R E S -F a iri 
Has tank and waU( 
Priced at $700/acrtT^

k ' Pasture. 4  minerals, 
of Cisco on Hwy. 183.

22 ACRES - North of Eastland. Mostly coastal with < 
tank. Nice location. $1,000.00 per acre.

20 ACRES - Scenic and ruBti« »«ea. Scattered trees, ci­
ty water available 5 SOLD of Cisco, ideal mobile 
home site. Owner finance. aouu.OO

45 ACRES - All impre-’̂ «  native grasses, stock
tank. Oak tree countr, XASVET.$525/acre.

10 ACRES- S. of Cisco close to Union Center, 25 acres 
peanuts, 1 good water well, good fences. Will divide. 
$625/acre.

85 ACRES - All improve, p - 'x! native grasses. Scat­
tered oak trees, s to c i - - ^ ^ jo o d  fences. Old frame 
house. WILL TEXAS\ $525/acre.

63 ACRES - Some cultivation, beautiful trees. Ex­
cellent building site, fenced, city water. Some 
minerals. Pavement frontage. 750/acre. Assumable 
financing.
50 ACRES - Secluded 35 acres timber, river bottom, 2 
tanks, well, 15 acres cultivation with small 1 bedroom 
house S. of Cisco. Some owner finance. $850/acre.

97 ACRES-about 4  native pasture, some im­
provements. Older frame house and dairy bam. Owner 
finance. $567.00/acre.
124 ACRES - ? on this property. Travel
Trailer included. 1 a W » ^ m r e .  $50,000 
230 ACREIS - All in coastal and love grass. Excellent 
hunting. Well water, stock tank, some minerals. Will 
divide. $495/acre
300 ACRES - Two miles from Eastland, some timber, 
native and improved grasses, 2 tanks. Excellent ranch 
land. Financing arranged. 425/acre.
420 ACRES - Peanut farm. Fully cultivated and ir­
rigated, 4  minerals. Beautiful 4 bdrm., 3 bath home 
with fireplace. Excellent investment. Call for more 
details.

We have several other tracts of land from 37 acres up 
to'78 acres. Priced from $685/acre to |900/acre. Each 
tract has trees and at least one tank.

Owner will consider financing. Call for more details.

We have many other listings on ranches, motels, and apartments.
iddltXlKaid 619-17(1 Md« nraM  61947S7 CaMrt MwtdHIi (S3-2472

FHA-VA-CONVENTIONAL FINANCING 
We want to SELL your listing.

Robert M. Kincaid, Broker
Id'iV » /sri



PAT MAYNARD 
REAl ESTAH

INT. 20 E. NORTH SIDE 
629-8568 EASTLAND 

442-1880 CISCO 
IF NO ANSWER CALL 442-1933

HOMES 4  LOTS
A very nice 3 bedroom home in Olden. Carpeted, ceil­

ing fans, water well and beautiful yard. 139,600.

An older 3 bedroom frame home on comer lot. Needs 
some work done on it. Terms can be arranged. $17,000.

I
Owner Financed! A 3 bedroom, lAi bath frame home. 

Some carpet, panel ray heat. $23,000.

A large 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with permanent 
siding Carpeted, some paneling, fireplace, carport and 
detached garage. $29,900.

A nice 3 bedroom frame home close in. Carpeted, 
fireplace, central heat and detached garage. $37,500. 
13^% loan available.

,  3 bedroom, 2 bath frame. Carpeted, living room plus
den with fireplace, built-in oven and range top. $32,500.

A nice lake cabin on deeded lo t Good boat dock and 
boat storage. $29,500. Terms available.

A large 5 bedroom home on comer lot. 2 story. Better 
hurry on this one. $23,500.

Close In, a 2 bedroom, 1 bath older home that is 
carpeted. Located on large lot. $21,500.

lake  laon! 1 bedroom, 1 bath home on deeded lot. 
Screened in porch, fully carpeted. $25,000.

One acre tracts In Ranger. Ideal home sites near new 
school. All city utilities. $2,500 each.

We have owner financed lots and others at Lake Leon.

Lake laon! A 1 bedroom, 1 bath lake home with a 
large den, including a Ben F'ranklin fireplace. Located 
on a 276’ x 300’ deeded lot.

COMMERCUL

In Cisco! A nice brick building with 5,000 sq. ft. in 
prime downtown location. $60,000.

In Elastland! A 25 x 100, 2 story building on square. 
Ideal for offices. $75,000.

In Eastland! A 50' x 100’ building. Gose to downtown. 
Ideal for retail business. $32,500.

On hlway 80 E. approx, a 10 acre tract and 20 acre 
tract of land. Ideal location for a business. Utilities 
available.

1.3 acres joining railroad tracks with spur. 3 buildings, 
one has office and bath, and a 2,000 gallon underground 
gas tank. $75,000.

In Cisco! Large lot on Hiway 80 E. with older building 
and garage. $18,500, will divide.

In Ranger! 9 acres on Hiway 80 W. 1800 sq. ft. office, 
24,000 sq. ft. shop building, 2400 sq. ft. warehouse, other 
buildings and commercial antenna. Owner will sell or 
consider long term lease.

In Cisco! Good commercial building with about 1100 
aq. ft. Good location with main street frontage. Only 
$19,500.

la Rising Star, dstablished service station and garage. 
Located on busy highway near main downtown intersec­
tion. Good Income Potential. $40,000.

Lot on Interstate 20 Elast, approx. 4  acre located near 
Best Western. Perfect for offices or business. $16,000.

We have a place that would be a good location for most 
any business. There is an 1840 sq. ft. building with ample 
policing on 4 lots. This is a fast food business. It is now 
priced at $60,000, which includes all equipment.

Located on Hiway 80 E. near 120, approx. 14 acres 
with old house and large metal garage. Now used as a 
wrecking yard. $54,000.

FARMS 4  RANCHES

181 acres located between Carbon and Gorman. Ap­
prox. 60 acres of cultivation. Included are: an extra nice 
3 bedroom, 2 bath mobil home and a new 3 room and 
bath home that needs some finish work. Bams, pens, ci- 

‘ ty water and good tanks. $140,000.

Near Cisco, 40 acres with 2 bedroom home with city 
water. 3 good stock tanks, reasonably priced at $45,000.

174 acres near Gorman off Desdemona hiway. Water 
well, natural gas available, V4 minerals. $25,000.

52 acres located north of Eastland on Wayland hiway. 
All in cultivation, four tanks, 2 water wells, bams 4  
pens, and good fences. $52,000.

10 acre tracts near Gorman located on old Hiway 6. Ci­
ty water available. $10,000.

147 acres near Carbon with approx. 80 acres cleared. 
Fair to good fences, road frontage on three sides and 
some minerals. $500 per acre with terms.

SO acres south of Eastland near L ^ e  Leon. 15% down, 
owner financed, $50,000.

We have ten acre tracts and up on hiway near Lake 
Leon. $11,000 and up, owner will finance.

500 acres north oi Eastland on highway. Kline and 
native. An older 2 bedroom, 1 bath home with fireplace. 
Bam and other outbuildings. $530 per acre.

320 acres located between Carbon and Gorman. Some 
cultivation but mostly wooded. Good fences and hunting, 
some minerals included. $450 per acre with terms.

10 acres near Eastland. 120 frontage. $3500 per acre. 
Terms can be arranged.

Approx. 55 acres in Ranger. Ideal location for subdivi­
sion. Utilities available. $1500 per acre.

A 2 bedroom, 1 bath home only one year old. Located 
on 5 acres south of Cisco. Carpeted, screened in porch, 
extra nice. $48,000.

12 acres in edge of Ranger, good grass, fair fences. 
$18,000.

34 acres, with stock tank, located approx. 1 mile from 
Eastland. $6500

CISCO HOMES
Extra large 3 bedroom, 14 bath home, central heat, 2 

window units. 2 bedrooms in other section by carport. 
Separate heat and air. Double garage and double car­
port, all on 4 chain link fenced lots.

Near Cisco! 4 acres, a large 3 bedroom home that is 
carpeted, paneled and with a woodbuming heater. Love­
ly tree shaded yard with pecan and oak trees.

A large 2 story home with apartment attached, located 
on a comer lot. A very scenic yard with lots of trees. This 
is a versatile house.

A large 2 or 3 bedroom home on 3 big lots with about 30 
oak trees, lots of fruit trees, big fenced garden, storage 
building and also has mobil home hook-ups. This home 
has been recently remodeled and has new carpet and 
lots of cabinets.

Big 2 story older home. First floor could be used for a 
business and still have 3 bedroom 14 bath upstairs. 
Also, has a basement and big attic, which could be used 
for more living space. Good location and reasonably 
priced. $26,000.

A nice 3 bedroom, 14 bath home on corner lot. Central 
air and heat, new carpet, modem kitchen and built-in 
dishwasher. Also, a garage and storage area.

A 3 bedroom home with large rooms, central heat and 
air, carpet, paneling, lots of closets, built-in oven and 
range, big pecan trees, comer lot. Priced to sell.

A large 3 bedroom, 14 bath, 2 story carpeted home. 
Large game room and also a study which could be a 4th 
bedroom. As a bonus, two rent houses go with property, 
which are fully furnished. 2 large comer lots with 
several fruit and other trees.

LEASE PROPERTY

1600 sq. f t  rock building with extra lot for lease. $600 
per month.

3 bedroom, 2 bath brick home on 40 acres to lease. 
Must be at least a six months lease. $500 a month, first 
and last, plus $500 damage deposit.

For Lease! Commercial 6.8 acres in Olden. Septic tank 
and utilities available.

For Commercial use only. One to five acres with 120 
frontage.

We hove other home, hmd, and commercial Hsthigt.

Koy Bailey 
A n o d ato
029-2365
Qndye Foster

We oppredote your listings ond busineui
PotMoynord

Brokor
629-8063

JudyOims
Affodat#

629-1218

InGormoir RusselCordeH InOsco AnnWHHams

734-2690

I

COME.. LOOK US OV ER!

Colony Homes has already built three model homes to 
give you a general idea of how beautiful your new home 
could be.

We have thirty-eight different floor plans for you to 
choose from. There’s one that’s just right for you and your 
family. And we have plenty of financing available too!

Our homes range from 1,000 to 1800 square feet in size 
and our prices are not out of reach either. In fK t  they 
start from the middle 30’s and up.

So come on out and have a look for yourself. We’ld like 
the opportunity to show you around.

You’ll Be Glad You Did!

401 Colony Street 
Eastland, Texas 
(817) 629-8571

KING INSURANCE AGENCY
CISCO 

106 W. 6th 
442-2552

RANGER

REAL ESTATE
Mrs. Opol C. King-Broker 

Res. 64M510

RANGR 
207 Main 
647-1171

REAL NICE two-bedroom, one bath dwelling, carpet, 
nice kitchen cabinets, car-port with storage room, 
small building, fenced back yard, comer lot. Priced 
right for $13,500.00. Owner will carry, with 4  down.

LAKE LEON
Lake dwelling, large living area with wood burning 

Franklin stove, large bedroom, drearing ro an  and bath, 
kitchen, nice carpet and drapes, storage building with 
porch, T.V. antena. Butane (250 gal.). Staff Water. Deed­
ed lot with nice shade trees.

TWO BEDROOM HOUSE, 2 nice lots, paneled, 
carpeted, good neighborhood. $21,000.

GOOD COMMERGAL location: two bedroom house, 
store building, trailer park with six hook-ups, lots of 
beautiful trees, on 23 lots, on Hwy. 80, inside city limts.

3 BR, 2 bath, mobile home, with large addition includes, 
large den with sliding glass doors on to cement patio! 
bedroo, bath and walk-in closet, 2 car garage and bam, 
shop building on 3 acres just outside city limits.

CISCO
m w  USTDIO

Very nice two-bedroom, living room, dining area,’ 
one bath, kitchen with plenty of catanets, attached 
garage, GIA, fenced back yard. FHA Financed.

STRAWN
VERY NEAT 2 bedroo'^wv use, fenced yard, comer, 

lot, 2 out buildings.

YOU MUST SEE! REA Nice two-bedroom and enclosed 
porch, living-dining rc kitchen, one bath, two-car 
garage, completely^ f ^ ^ fied with very nice furniture, 
drapes, dish«, ci neighbahood. READY TO
MOVE INTO. All of (his for only $27,500.00.

We need and appreciate your listings

44M880

Arifili OUW9Ê 
442.3134

Potrid« C. Nowok 
473.5231

VA And FHA FINANCING

lOOOOOO®®*

43VL3MI



I f t r ior Dtsignt For Tho Nondicopped
If you tre  planning a 

new house which will 
be used by a 
wheelchair resident, 
careful planning and a 
little extra expense 
can make life much

easier for that person.

Entry ways should 
be 36 inches wide with 
interior doors of the 
sliding of pocket type 
with 32-inch openings.

Sunday, September 6, 1981
AiUMMUM tWMOOWt 

CUndM AND STANOAM)
STOMA MMOOWS

vM n stOMC 
smrrc 

tTH l SIOMC

Eliminate thresholds 
and increase hall wid­
ths to 3 ^  to four feet.

The bathroom should 
permit a five-foot turn­
ing radius with the fix­
tures arranged for 
easy transfer to the 
toilet. Grab bars and 
lifting aids are a must, 

j » . . ,

and make certain they 
are attached to a firm 
support.

Set the vanity high 
enough so the 
w heelchair can go 
underneath. Finally, 
instal l  au tomat i c  
garage door openers 
and covered entries.

All these items make the handicapped, but 
life at home easier for independent, person.

G ish In On Solar Energy

, » v » 5

D  &  R  E N E R G Y  S A V E R S
P O  BOX 603 

CISCO, TEXAS 76437

Free Estimates
LEAD'NG ExffBMINATpP

T C
M E  RO BBIN S Phofi«  (8 1 7)  4 4 }  1 S 3 1

:  WE SPRAY 
:  YARDS & TREES 
t 114 W. Conner

KO BI K I  HARBIN 
Ph h2>J 2'13

L»____

Energy from the sun 
is free, so why not 
‘‘cash in” on it when 
building a home?

Posi t ioning your 
home in relation to the 
sun ’s movement  
throughout all seasons 
can save money on 
utility bills. A house 
should be oriented 
along an east-west 
axis, with the longest 
walls and largest roof 
plane facing south to

take advantage  of 
winter sun and allow 
for easy shading in the 
summer.

Family rooms, living 
rooms and sim ilar 
areas used frequently 
in daylight hours, plus 
walls that have the 
greatest number of 
windows, should be 
located on the south 
side. Shade these win­
dows from the summer 
sun by suing 
overhangs, porches or

trellises. summer, but will allow
winter sunshine to 

These ideas will help enter windows add 
keep out the heat in lower the heating bill

F SPECIAL I
C a rp e ts  C le an e d  O n ly  ■

fo r a n y  liv in g  room . J 
D ry in g  tim e 'SO .m inut^ .^  .«  

n i  m ove fu rn itu re  4  put it  b a ck . J  
.A n y  ad d itio n a l r o o m ,'  15” , |

a n y  h a ll  *5” . * an ti-so il h ^ atm ep fjj 
*2 7 ”  liv -d in . com bo. *

R & R  C A R P n  C L E A N IN G  i  
RcndaU C A L L  T O D A Y

629-1121% V iV l

J J E A L T O R j , JAMES W. R A n i F F .R EA LTO R *

REALTOR-BROKER
HOMES-RANGER

New listing; Mobil home on Travis street, two 
bedrooms, one bath, all furniture that comes with a 
mobil home i;oes Storage house goes with this place. 
Priced to seU $7,750.00

About a year and a half old. two bedroom brick home, on 
two loU. central heat and vented evaporaUve cooling. 
One bath, range, dishwasher, fenced back yard. This is a 
comer lot, 1006 Foch Street.

New listing on Pine Street, three bedrooms, one bath 
older home Uiat need someone to work on it. Very large 
rooms, could be made into a very nice place Two loU go 
with this house $22,500.00.
Three bedroom, one bath, large living and dining room 
combinaUon. Central heat and air, washer dryer connec­
tions. Seperate garage and storage room. This house is 
on two lots on Main Street $30,000 00 
Approi 5 acres of land in City limits with a three 
bedroom, two bath house. Central heat and air, horse 
bams, garage and storage. Very attractive place. 
$45,000 00
Bnck three bedrooms, two full baths, den with wood bur­
ning fireplace, kitchen with double oven, coming 
cooktop, dining room combinaUon, central heat and air, 
uUlity room with washer and dryer connections. Fenced 
back yard with covered paUo. Two storage buildmgs. 

.This u  in a nice neighborhood. $75,000.00

6 4 7 -1 2 6 0
Brick three bedrooms one and a half baths. I^irge den, 
central heat and air, range and dishwasher. This house 
is in Meadowbrook addition and would make some fami­
ly a very nice home. FHA Financing available.
Two bedrooms, one bath, close to down town. Needs very 
little work, double garage. This house is on 14 lots, a 
good buy at $10,000.00
1980 Mobil home on eight lots. Three bedrooms, two full 
baths, carport, central heat and air. There is a large 
24x30 steel building with concrete floor that goes with 
this place, also a 14 x 20 storage building. $65,000 00 some 
owner financing.
Rock two bedroom, central heat, one bath, living roon. 
large kitchen, washer connection, range, refrigerator, 
would like to sell furnished. This house has 44  lots, six 
pecan trees and several fruit trees. $40,000.00

•">“‘ 6 4 7 -1 6 6 7
COMMERCIAL PROPERTY

7,000 square foot Delta Steel Building in Ranger. This 
building has a large truck scale that goes with the 
building.

Two lots on Hwy. 80 just next to JRB. A good commer­
cial location.

Three story brick i SOLD Ranger with twelve lots.

Ten acres of land in the city limits, good place to 
develop. Will sell worth the money, $10,000.

RANCH OUT OF RANGER
961 acres on 1-20 just east of Ranger, excellent hunting 
place. Will run 60 pairs year round, small but nice house 
with central heat and air. 'i

JUST OUT OF RANGER
a  acres of land with a four bedroom house, two full
baths, Franklin Stove, very kitchen with plenty of 
cabinet space. D ishw ash '^^^ge and ovens, large pan­
try. Lots of closet sp av f^ id  storage. Several outside

LAKE PROPERTY
Tile block house on deeded lot, one large bedroom with 
very large living room with sleeping facilities. This 
place has a nice boat dock. All furniture goes with this 
$30,000 00

Very nice small lake house on deeded lot. One large 
bedroom, kitchen, living room, then a large bedroom on 
the lake side. This on a good fishing part of the lake with 
a boat dock. $22,500.00

buildings, metal pens, water well, fenced garden spot. 
$58,000.00

160 acres of land, one tank, 87 acres in cultivation, good 
fences, some improved pasture, V4 minerals. Owner will 
sell parts of this place also.

We solicit your listings on any type of Reol Estate 
Oneta Robinson Associate 629-1467 I 2 ï

CaUAL HOUSING 
•fPORTUaiTIfS I

C ^ n h i n ^
^ 2 1

T*''KTgTimng,s” rr‘2T iôû^s"lôcâtëT ln”f!â.«îÏÏimd

H___  ______
FOWLER REALTORS

820 West Mlin 629-1769  
Bill GHfmti, Broker

Residential
Eastland

IN EASTLAND: Three apartments that gross mon­
thly $435 00 Upstairs can be made into another apart­
ment. Carport and furnishings sUys with apartment
f i J ----------
I WE HAVE new homes under construction. Call for' 
details.

COMFORTABLE bedrooms, living
room, formal dining rot

TWO BEDROOM, 1 bath - has wall furnace and 
refrigerated air condition, carport on side of house, 
carpeted. This is only $25,000.00. E-5 

NICE small 2 bedrom, 1 bath, central heat and air 
Goae to school. $18,000.00. Owner finance. E-9 

NEAT 2 bedroom, 1 bath on nice comer lot, close to 
school, owner financing available. E-4.

UNDER CONSTRUCTION: Beautiful new fouP 
bedroom, 2 bath home in exc^'ent location • to consist of 
1854 sq. ft., fireplace, 'indows, Jenn-aire drop-
in oven, high effec ienc^^at pump, dish cabmets and 
other extras. This will be a beauty.

GREAT LOAN assumption. $4,000 down and take up 
payments of $306 00 a month at 11.5% interest on this 3 
bedroom, 1 bath home, e.jo 

EXCELLENT INCOME PROPERTY 3 apartments 
with 100% occupancy gross monthly income of $435 00 
Property need some repair, if you are a handy man this 
is for you. El

FRESH ON MARKET Nice Brick home on large lot, 
house has approx. 2400 sq. ft. living area 4 BR, 2 baths! 
Cent. H/A, Nice built in kitchen, custom made drapes, 
covered patio. Brick BQ pit and smoker in back yard, 
n ^  large oak trees. You must see this one. E-7 

Older Home: 3 bdrm, 1 bsth, all new kitchen cabinets 
and bathroom fixtures Completely restored. Central 
heat and new carpet and tile throughout. Being ap­
praised F.H.A. E-10
CHECK THIS ONE OUT. older home on two

. large Iota. Located OpJ A v P  ™my oak trees 3 
BR, 1 bath, 2 firepla 6 ^ . «  ouilt-ins, custom drapes, 
screened in porch, hardwood floors and carpeting. A 
terrlflc buy.

Rosezell Emerson 
629-8183

(?

iRanger. Priced 20 percent below market value. Special I 
Ilow interest rate for the right person. Will sell separate! 
lor j^ lw g e ._ O n l^ ^ ^ .________________ ___ _ j

3 BDRM, 2 bath home in good location. Needs some 
repairs. Carport, fenced back yard with storage bldg. 
Call for more information. E-2 

STORY B(M)K HOME: 1900 sq. ft. Owner will 
finance. 4 bdrms., 2 bath needs some repairs. E-19 

ROCK CHURCH 412 N. Bassett. Very spacious 
could be converted into residence. Already has two 
baths, two rooms that could be bedrooms. Kitchen 
with dining room. Worship hall could be huge living 
room. Call for details. E-6

Cisco
LOV ELY 3 bdrm, 2 bath home on large corner lot. 

Must see to appreciate. 2 car garage, large trees, close 
to schools. C-2

700 BLOCK EIGHTH STREET, fronts on Old Hwy. 80 - 
2 bedroom, 1 bath stucco house, excellent commercial 
property. Taking offers. C-6 

A VERY GOOD BUY A nice well kept older home 
with approx. 1000 sq. ft. on 24  lots. Large storage 
building with electricity 2 separate garages. Storm 
cellar. Nice garden spot. Beautiful fruit trees. 3 BR. 1 
bath. Very comfortable home on a quiet street. Call 
?bout this one. C-1

647-1302

NICE three b g Q | j | (

le bath fully carpeted

Ranger
IN RANGER, nice 2 bdrm., 1 bath. Has a breakfast 

room and a 1 car garage. This house is close to school 
R-2

TWO bedroom, 1 bath home with central heat, 
fireplace, fenced in backyard. FHA. R-13

NEW ON THE MARK»=-r - -  >rgv efficient home, 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, -oom, large den, cen­
tral heat and air. o>uy t  vears old. FHA.

TWO bedroom. 1 bath home with two car garage on 
large lot. FHA appraised. R-11 __

BRICK home with 3 bedroom, 14 bath in the MeadoiT 
Brook Addition. R-7

NICE 3 bedroom bnck home with 14 bath in the 
Meadow Brook Addition. R-1

PARTIALl.Y BRirif * droom, 2 bath energy effi­
cient home appr. U Q W - years old with central heat 
and air, 12 x 22 cox .. eo patio and is on comer lot. Finan- 
.cuig available

TWO b e e  M M  V M  home with fireplace, carpet,
nice cabinet S V l s J lA

ATTOACnVE 3 b-g— _  — central H/A ex­
cellent locaUon F H. 8 0 1 * 7

sm a l l  2 bedroom^^one bath home in good location 
for only $9,000 00 R-2

ONE bedroom, 1 bath home with den, wood heater, 
carport, FHA appraised. R-9

bath, completely
remodeled home.

SMALL LhretjMmwew 
home on large 1 ® ^ “ **^

REMODELED: Three bedroom, one bath carpeted 
home. One car garage, close to schools, church and 
shops. FHA. R-5

NICE: Three bedroom, one bath, den home. Com­
pletely carpeted. Back of house has a efficiency apt. 
Call for details. R-3

Lake Property
NICE 1 bedroom, 1 bath home on deeded lot at Lake 

Leon with city water, all new plumbing, Ben Franklin 
wood heater. LP-13

CHARMING CABIN IN REMOTE LOCATION
Receding water does not detract from this cozy 1 
bedroom with fireplace. Plenty of trees, fenced yard, 
and year-round neighbors. $17,000.00. Some owner finan­
cing. LP-11.

LAKE LEON - Nice Lake home on deeded lot, city 
water, good boat dock, 3 BR. - 1 bath, 2 fireplaces, 
beautifully landscaped. This is a very pretty place. 
LP-1

LAKE HOME: One bedroom, one bath large living 
( room overlooks lake. Builtin kitchen, stove, 

dishwasher and disposal. Antenna with UHF attach­
ment. Back of lot slopes gently down to the lake. Call 
for more information. LP-4

Country Homes & Acreage
Acreage

1122 DESDEI SOLD •drm, 1 bath.
55 ACRES good building site. Across from new high 

school in Ranger. May be subdivided or sold as a unit. 
A-6

FREISH ON MARKET 60 acres about 12 miles South 
of Cisco, 30 acres Coastal, IS acres in Love Grass, rest 
in timber, 1 tank and 1 hand dug well. Call for details 
A-1

4 Acres off old hwy 80 E. 4  Block from city water 
mam. Excellent for pipe yard or for oilfield storage. 
A*10

NEAR NIMROD 189.8 ac nut allotment,
•ome minerals, grass, trees « V L D  , hunting. A-9.

20 ACRES, owner financing $3,000.00 down at 12% for 
five years. 4 mi. N.W. of Eastland-good fence aU culUva- 
iion, on Farm  to Market Road 3101. A-3 

SMALL ACREAGE TO BUILD ON between 2 and F 
acre tracts about 6 miles south of E^astland on Hwy. 6 - 
City water and electricity available. Call for details 
A-17

1884 ACRES Northwest of Ranger. Three tanks, 1 
water well, 1/8 minerals, good hunting. A-5

1.734 acres - Breckenridge Road, 3 bedrooms, 2 baths. 
Great condition. Call us. HA-7

480 acre ranch. Some uiir.crals. Executive home with 
many extras. Beautifully maintained! Oil and gas 
wells on acreage. HA-1

1.10 ACRES with a four bedroom one bath house on 
it. Elquity buy, loan assumption. Call now for more in­
formation. HA-9

Commercial & Lots
ATTENTION MERCHANTS - RELOCATE! ONE- 

half to ONE ACRE TRACTS, all utilities and pave 
street, situated in new shopping development. Ade­
quate parking space. $8,500.00. C-2

IN CISCO, 2 large lots with many oak trees. Utilities 
on property great for mobile home. L-15

THREE lots 25 x ww ‘s Original Town Site
Addition (Commert Ww Mm #

TWO lots, 400 Block of E. 19th in Cisco, has owner 
financing with 25% or 30% down. Also there are 8 lots 
back of the two that could be sold with them. Lr6 

LAKE LEON BUSINEISS with 3 bedroom siding home 
on water front, 2 gas pumps, 4 trailer hook-ups, store is 
600 sq. ft., 24’ x 30’ workshop, storeroom, storm cellar, 
staff water, garden spot. GOOD LOCATION AND A 
GOOD BUSINESS. CP-5

CISCO, LARGE COMMERCIAL Bldg., includes nice 
size apartment, 2 bay car wash, mobil home hookuo. 
Make offer. CP-8

DOWNTOWN CISCO Just 3 doors from proposed site \ 
of new bank, attractively remodeled for retail store or 
offices. CP-7

PACKED WITH POTENTUL Going buiness good in­
come, excellent location. Call for details. CP-8

approximately
43 X 75 with aUey dividmg them. Nice trees. Must see 
to appreciate. Cisco. Lr5

I-»  COMMERCUL LOTS IN CISCO -150 ft. frontane 
^  ̂ location !

raCELLENT BUSINESS LOCATION on Old Hwy. 80

M r
ONE lot on B riarw i^ , $6,000.00. L-2 
EXCELLENT commercial property on large corner 

lot - central air and heat - perfect for business offices 
Eastland. CP-12

LARGE COMMERCIAL lot, 188 x 144 fronts on old 
Highway SO E. Excellent for a fast-food restaurant or 
24-hour grocery store. CISCO. CP-10. ^ House with Acreage

LOOK US OVER BEFORE YOU LOOK
Wa Appraclitt Your Butlnoss

Bill Broker Underwood, Amoc. Broker Chris Frost Cruml
6 4 7 -1 6 3 5 ' 629-1188

AROUNO
Shirley Griffith 

647-1635 629-8224

I
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Lions 4th Annuol Benefit Bowl 
Set For Sept. 26 at 7:30 p.m.

for adulti and | 1.M for 
studenti in advance. All 
tickets will be $3.00 at the 
gate so buy early and save.

W O H D o K .O I)

WANTED

WORK WANTED House 
leveling, painting t>ams and 
hours • inside and out.

FREE ESTIMATES 
Pho. 817-643-3027 day or 
night. Tnf

EMPLOYMENT

I
AN EQUAL OPPORTUNI­
TY EMPLOYER is now ac­
cepting applications for part 
_  ^  tinoe secretarial help. Posi-

^WANTED All kinds of mef^ Lion requires typing, filing, 
chandise for consignment and preferbty short hand or 
auction to be held the 2nd dictation equipm ent ea- 
and 4th Thursday nights of perience and other general 
each month at Olden Gym. secretsirisd duties. Legal ex- 
Call 653-22S9. Starting time is perience preferred. For ap- 
7:30 p.m. TC . plication forms and inter-

................ . c o n ta c t C rim in a l
WANTED TO; BUY: Used District Attorney’s office Se-
fumiture. S&K Sales, 515 E. cond floor cou rthouse ,
M ain, E as tlan d ."  C all Eastland, Texas. T-74
629-2241« T-IOS
• ly^****»*****»***............. WELDERS WANTED ‘
WANT TO BUY: U sS  lu rn f' Stephens Tanks, Inc. in
lure. S&K Sales, 515 E.’ Abilene is taking applica-
Main, Eastland. Call 62B- tions for welders to work the
8382 or 629-2241. T-C nlRht shift. Night crew will
................ ...............................  work 40 hours per week and
MAN, 42, wanU a wife • a wiU be paid for 50 hours. Two
nice woman, aged 20 to 40, no weeks paid vacations per
children, who likes to cook year. Hospital insurance
and be a homemaker. Own employee and depen-
my own home and am a ^ants. Uniforms furnished, 
heavy equipment operator. oqo life insurance policy 
Write to Lee Spencer, Box employee and cancer
84, Brady, Texas 70825. policy paid by Stevens

Tanks. We are also looking

WAfir’ ‘LlkND t o “ l ^
Call 829-2401; 629-2446 or T "
629-2507 T-76 Ewing at 915-677-0281 collect.
• «••••«»■■«««««•••••••••••a TNF

FOR SALE: 1980 Chevrolet, 
Z-28 with t-top and electric 
windows call 629-1726 or 
629-1495. Tnf

FOR SALE: like new cor­
onet $200.00. Call 653-2437. 
Tnf

‘78 DATSUN KING CAB PU
New motor, has less than 500 
miles on it, 44,458 total miles. 
Priced $1100 below retail at 
$3500.2 miles south of Rising 

'S ta r . G eorge Webb 
817-6434144. 34-ltc

Choice Building Sites 
Located East Side of 

Eastland near Gibsons 
Starting at $3,008.00 

Can build to suit your 
needs or you build 

A-lSnles 
215 S. Walnut 

629-2102 Anytime

FOR SALE: 1978 Ford pick­
up with automatic transmis­
sion, air, power steering and 
brakes with twin tanks. Pric­
ed $2,675.00, Ph. 6294977. 
T-73

Nice 3 bedroom home for 
sale by owner. Buy equity 
and assume 10 percent loan 
with low monthly payments. 
W/w carpet with big kitchen. 
On 11/2 lots with big trees in 
nice neighborhood. 812 
Young St. Cali Wayne or 
Kim at 647-1590 or 647-1161 
for appointment. T-76

HOUSE FOR SALE BY 
OWNER: 3 bedroom, 2 bath. 
307 South Oak, Eastland. 
Call 629-1487 or 442-9979. p-73

FOR SALE: 1981 SUverado 
Che verölet pickup; short 
wheel base; 305 engine; 
buckets s e a ts ;  AM-FM 
stereo, sliding rear window, 
low mileage, excellent condi- 

, Uon. Call 442-1398. T-73

NOTICE

AIR
CONDITIONING

Service man and in­
s ta l le r s  needed  in 
E as tlan d , Tx. with 
growth advancem ent 
and good pay.

Paid Holidays 
Group Insurance 
Trucks and Power 

Tools Famished
AN EXCELLENT job oppor- Uniforms Famished
tunity for mature, responsi- collect,
ble male. Must be able to fiU Condition
foreman’s position. Good 817-968-8871
pay, fringe benefits. If in-
terestml contact 817-734-2757 EMPLOYMENT: Need a 
or 734-2510, Gorman, Tx. mature person for 3-11 p.m. 
T.73 shift. Hillcrest Grocery 1401
......................... . w. Main. 629-1600. T-73

HOUSEWIVES NEEDED: J^EEDED ••*ruTr****trme 
For light construction work. , j  w uu
in an all weather facility. «em U ry  and b o ^ e e ^ r
Hours 9:00 a.m. to 2:30 p.m.w .. ,, . ■*, _ com pany b e n e fits , in-Mon. thru Friday. Starting r  7 • _

, . ««c« L surance, vacation and goodrate at $3.50 per hour; with „  . . j  , .. j  iM j  « 1 P*y- If interested contactraise at end of 30 days. Apply L. , _ , .  ,.w  D ij u  CO P ean u t C o rp o ra tio n  of at Morgan Buddings,Hwy 69 «T7 r»i-W 7 «rfti j a t:« 1 AlTicnCfl At BlV*736*í75T OrNorth Eastland. An Equal t ,  t mc- 1 -»-».it:- 734-2510, Gorman, Tx. T-73Opportunity EImployer. TNF ,« ,„« ,,* ,„*««««i,«„„««,»

CISCO Nursing Center is 
now taking applications for
7-3 LVN’s and nurses aides HEILP WANTED: Cashiers 
for all shifts. Starting saUry ^  experienced is^nd Iwlp.
for LVN’s is $5 00 an hour P®"®"... . .  Truck Harbor. Interstate 20
with evaluation for raises in Cisco p-76
90 days. Contact Frances
Terry, 442-1471, Cisco. TNF HF.I.P WANTED: Waitress
WAÍÍraD-*DVr*ei:VoVof n LI^ bookkeeper. Apply inWANifcu. uirecioroi murs- person at White Elephant
ing,BlackweUHospital,Gor- EfesUurant, In te r s U te M
man, Texas. Phone 734-2294. yiiest, Cisco, p-76
TNF

HELP NEEDED NO ex-

REM D rillin g  629-1032 |
EasUand. Starüng pay $4.00
per hour. Tnf For Sale: 1»74 ToyoU
........... . Célica, automatic, new

W E' ARE NOW h iring  radial tires, air condl-
machine operators. Starting Uoaed; very clean and
sa la ry  $3.50. E xcellen t in perfect ninnlng con-
benefits, paid vacation, diUon, just tuned up. 27
group in su ra n c e , paid  mpg. Only $2100.00. Call
holidays. Apply in person at M7-3264. T-74
Russell NewnianMfg. Co. on ••••••••••••••••••••••••••••
1-20, Cisco, from 8:00 to 4:30, pQR SALE: 1973 Ford 
Mon. thru Fri. T-NF Mustang, good condition.

¿7 l7w A V lT FD “ * w i i r ^. K Ta' T  r  M after 5:00 62SM063. Tnf wanted to build oil field
tanks. Top wages. Call FOR SALE:'Three used gas
V**^«^J«^*>ir?f*l««««*«««*« conditioners and one us-
ü : —  -- . .  , ed gas furnace. As is, where
M lP WANTED: One every ^
two weeks general house E a s tla n d
clean ing  Telegram. 629-1707. tf
References. 629-2413. TNF ••••••••••••••••••••••••«•••
JOB * O PPO R'H jÑ rre f o r  SALE: 1976 Black Lin- 
male or female. Peanut Cor- coin Continental Mark IV. 
poraUon of America. Gor- Cartier addiUon. loaded, tilt 
man. TX. at 817-734-2757 or » » ^ l-  »Poke wire wheels. 
734-2510 T-73 exceptionally clean with
.•••••*•••••••••••••••••••••• leather interior reclining
HELP WANTED: Qualified seats. Ph. 817-643-4176.34-ltc 
Pulling Unit Opeators with ^««*»»*«««««««««««««*«««««««« 
minimum three years ex- F6r SALE: 'Antique Glass and 
perience. Call Sunbelt Well Furniture' and other collectables. 
Service at 629-1493. T-73 •gf, l>yjl Estates’. The House of 
EhdPLOYMENT Secretary Antiques moved to 908 So. 
wanted, preferably with oU Bassett. Eastland, Tesas open 
a n d g a se x p e r i« iM .A p p ^  emfydW-MOS 
ment only. Mary Beaty. Pho.
629-2688. T-tnf FOR SALE: Three ton cen-

, •••••••••••••*•••••••••••••* tral a ir, good condition
HELP WANTED: Cisco $350.00. Call 442-1229 after^ 

Nursing Center Is now ac- noon or come by 303 W. 3rd in 
cepting applications for Cisco. TNF 
LVN’s or GVN’s 7-3 and 3-11
shifts. Starting salary for FOR SALE: Sim m ental 
LVN’s $S hour. Please coo- BuIU. Phone 817-643-7431. 
Uct Betty Hart, Director of 
N in as, 817•44^N7L ihOltfc _____

Metal Buildings 
All Welded Constraction 
Clear Span to 60’ Wide 

Any Length
Built to suit your needs 

A-1 Sales 
215 S. Walnut 

629-2102 Anytime

Notice:
Land Development Service 
(1) Land CLeaning, (2) 
Farm and Ranch Improve­
ment, (3) Tearacing, (4) 
Other Improvements. Ex­
p e rien ced  B ulldozer 
Operator. Further informa­
tion, call after 6 p.m. (817) 
629-2068. '  t -73

NOW LEASNG OFFICES in 
the Petroleum  Building 
(formerly Eastland Bank 
Building) catered to your 
decor. Reasonable rates; 
many extras. View by ap­
pointment only! Big Country 
R eal E s ta te .  629-2281; 
44M693 or 44M707 evenings.
TNF

WWW»»»»

GARAGE SALES

DUPLEX FOR RENT» 2 
bdrm, It^ bath with stove. 
Fully carpeted and draped. 
Central air and heat. $300.00 
per month plus $100.00 
damage deposit. No more 
than 2 children. No pets. 
Pho. 629-2175. T-tnf

A P A R T M E N T S
ROOMS

&

Fuimshed. ail bills paid in­
cluding cable. Plio. 62i)-8849. 
By day; week or inontli. T-C

FOR RENT: 1 and 2 
bedroom apartments. Ap­
pliances furnished. Water 
and cable paid. 501 S. 
Ostrom. Pho. 629-2805. T-73

FOR RE!ilT:furnished or un­
furnished apts. at Royal 
Oaks apartments, 1304 Royal 
Lane, Cisco. Pho. 442-3232 or 
442-2709. T-C

Complete Remodeling 
C o n cre te -E lec tric a l- 

Roofing
P a t io s -D r lv e w a y s -  

Room Additions 
S id in g - W I n d o w s -  

Plumbing 
Chain Link Fence 
No job to large for 

A-1 Sales 
215 S. Walnut 

629-2102 Anytime

REAL ESTAn
FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
bedroom house, $25,000.00. 
Terms. Owner will finance 
aL 12% interest. Call 442-1561, 
Cisco. p-60tfc

Tickets for the Fourth An­
nual Lions Club Benefit 
Football Bowl went on sale 
today according to Tom 
Brashier of the Ranger 
Lions, chairm an of this 
year’s game. Lions from the 
local clubs will be selling the 
tickets for the big grudge 
match between Cisco Junior 
College and Ranger Junior 
College to be played Satur­
day, September 26th, at 7:30 
p.m. at Buckaroo Stadium in 
Breckenridge.

The Benefit Bowl has 
grown into one of the biggest 
Charity fund raising projects 
among area ^o n s and this 
year promises to be even 
bigger with the participation 
of four more local com- 
munitities. In addition to the 
Lions from Breckenridge, 
(Carbon, Cisco and Ranger, 
the 1981 game welcomes the 
Lions from Albany, Baird, 
Clyde and Eastland.

During the last three years 
close to $20,000 has been rais­
ed by the Benefit Bowl for 
Lions charities. This money 
has gone to the Texas Lions 
(Tamp for Crippled, Blind 
and Diabetic C^ldren, The 
District 2E-1 Eye Bank, the 
Uons-CARE program, the 
Lions International Founda­
tion and local Lions projects.

The football game also has 
all of the makings of being 
the best ever. Ranger rolled

ANTIQUE SaI E :  Ox yoke 
an tiq u es, bo ttles, ja rs , 
crocks, 78 RPM records and 
some junk. Bert kent, Gor­
man, first street east of 
Blackwell Hospital and one 
block south. 817-734-2728. 
T-72

NOW is the time to clean that 
dirty chimney. Get ready for 
those cool fall evenings. Call 
639-2307. T-77

PAINT CONSTRUCTION- 
Interior & Exterior walls. 
.\lso dry wall and taping. 
Call Carl Kerr 647-3197. Tnf

FOR SALE: Lake lot at 
Lake Granba’7 . Also 2 
bedroom bouse In need 
of repairs 007 West 11th 
SL, Cisco. Priced to sell. 
Call 44M005, Cisco, p-71

up big victories in 1978 and 
1979 en route to their two 
best seasons in history, vic­
tories in the Beef Bowl and 
Rodeo Bowls, a national 
championship and a 21-game 
winning streak. That streak 
came to an end last year at 
the hands of Cisco in the 
Benefit Bowl. Cisco used 
that momentum to propel 
themselves to their finest 
season in recent memory, 
and a national ranking. 
Ranger slumped to a 9-2 
season and began looking 
forward to a return match 
with Cisco.

To say there is bad blood 
between the two schools is an 
understatement. . Although 
they used to play each other 
twice in a season, the games

got so hard on both coaches 
that (Doach Bill Anderson of 
Cisco and Jerry Trice of 
Ranger reduced the rivalry 
(0 a once a year melee. Now 
the Benefit Bowl has truly 
become a special contest for 
the players of both teams, 
one that the squads view as a 
‘real’ bowl game. At any 
rate it is no longer just 
another scrimmage for the 
Rangers, because with a vic­
tory this year Cisco could 
even the series.

Area Lions urge all foot­
ball fans to get their tickets 
now for this great match-up 
and remind you that all pro- 
deeds go to charitab le  
works. Ask a local Lion for 
tickets and he’ll see that you 
get them. Tickets are $2.50

Paatai 4:1-8 
Hoar m« whan I call, O

God of my rlghtuoua- 
naas ; (hou haat anlarg- 
ad ma whan I waa In
diatrass; hava inarcy 
upon ma, and fiaar my 
prayer.

O ya aona of man, how 
long will ya turn my
glory into shame? How 
long will ya love vanity,
no 1antf seek after laaaing, 

Salah.

But know that the Lord 
hath aat apart him that 
la godly for himaaff: 
the Lord will 
I call unto him.
Stand in awe, and tin 

not: commune with 
yy>ur own heart upon 
your bad, aruf be still. 
Salah.
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! MEN'S PRAYER BREAKFAST(Come Dr»ss«d in Worlt Clothes)
6:00 A M . THIS FRIDAY

Nofi-O»noiiiifi«tioiiol in AtmotpiMr»

i t
White Elephoiit Dining Room 

id the StrIf You Need the Strength of Praising, 
Men's Qiristion FeUowshio, and God; 

You Come!"
Laymti "ONLY" Ar% Invited

hfl Schoofer, Director vVodo Hunter, Sec.

YOU NEED A TV a e iE  CONNECTION 
for complete television enjoyment

★  ★  ★
Ŝouthern Television Systems Corpi

Serving Gteo, Eastinnd, Ranger 
CoN U8 for complete ¡nformotion

N e e d  a  N e w  R o o f ?  ■
A ll T y p e s  *

W e  S p e c i a l i z e  in  H o t  T o p p i n g  S
c o m p o s i t i o n s  s h i n g l e s  ■

A L L  W o r k  G u a r a n t e e d  J

P a u l  W i l l i a m s  R o o f i n g  C o . J
( 8 1 7 ) 6 3 9 . 2 3 3 0  J

HELP WANTED
Full time employment ovoiloble 

for moture, relioble 
individuols

willing to worh 47-50 hours 
per week.

Apply in person of 
Qsco Lumber and Supply

p-73Wc|

THE REST OF
■m

MPT DRILLING
P.O. Box 733 

Graham, Texas 76046

CorlThombrve DimidPliMps
(8171549-0768 (817)549-4712
^ ^ p o c j a f c e i i n Ä j l o n J J i J O ^
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THE GOSPEL
»
»
»
»
»
»
4-
»
»
»
»

John 9:1-2 tells us that a man had been blind fram 
birth. Then they ask who did sin that he was bom bUad, 
him or his parents? If he had sinned and this sin caused 
him to be bora blind, then he would have had to exiated 
somewhere else and have been able to sia before he » ‘ 
was bora into this world. John 3:13 tells us that no man »  
has gone to heaven except that he came down from 
heaven firsL We would have been in heaven before we 
came to earth. In Jeremiah 1:4-5 the Lord says He 
knew him before be was conceived in the womb. 
Jeremiah existed before he came to earth. What is th» 
pre-existence; where was it and why don’t we 
remember it? Write to The Rest of the Gospel, P.O.

^  Box 763, Cisco, Texas 76437. p-78 ^

»
»
»

W ilh am i Pum ping  Serv ice  
R.L. (Rocky) Williams

P O eox 4SI
WSINO STAU TEXAS TS471

a ta c

TflirH O N I 
(•I7)«43 4e«3 
■ III! - - i i i i - a

PLUMBING
Spedai Rot»8 For Tlioto On Rx»d Inconiat
Corpentry A Electrical Al Work Gvoront»»d

647-1432
TF

WE CARE ABOUT 
YOUR HEALTH 

S p ec ia liz in g  in 
p h y sica l a ilm en ts  
related to the spine and 
nervous system.

Dr. Geo. G. MrPaul 
Chiropractor 

Telephone 647-3821 
454 Pine Street Ranger 

Please Clip & Save 
TC

IWTICE; Dofce Johnson ContrK-], 
tor Ramodclini, Concrete. Eltc-- 
tricat, flufflbini, Fencini, Boat;, 
Dock, Houst Lavetini. Call ' 
647 3612 or 647 3679. t-c

■w’w ar <w «»►

)??LEGAL PROBLEMS??!
Divorce from *49“  

Bankruptcy from *300“  
Simple Wills from *25“

fiRng fees not included
Soturday A Sunday appointments 

_  available.
Our temporary Office w ill: 

be in your area soon.
Full Legol Services availoble; 
including oil & gas leases, title 

opinions, etc. doll suits 
& crimmol octions

Terms Available
Willow Park Legal Clinic 

Weatherford, Texas 
(817) 441-7551 

Call 8-6 for appointment

insuB EEBPnaiìBinsiiiaiiaii
Naylor's Used Cars

1979 Monte Corto 
1978 Monte Corto

1978 Trans Am-yolow 
1977Ptyn»outfi 2 door

1975B»icfc4door 
1969 Ptymoutfi 4 door 

2-1979 ditv Dittol Pfeknp 
1979 Owv. Cuttomixod Vwi

1979 Ford Sopor Cnb 
1979 Ford PU

1910 Toyota Pfdiiip 
197S 1-ton Chov.

1977 Ford PU 
19760itv.PU 
19750itv.PU 
19730IOV.PU 
2-1972 Ford PU 
1970GMCPU 

1972 Ford Cvstomiiod Von
1977 Ch»v. Station W



OI' Rip Lived 3 0  Years 
Seoled in Cornerstone -  ^
No Food, No W oter, No Air!

T h u r s d a y ,  S o p t o m b o r  1 0 . 1981

Sealed inside a cornerstone for m ore than 30 years, an 
am azing toad not only survived without air,  food or w a­
ter, he becam e a nationwide celebrity — an astounding 
Rip Van Winkle of the animal  world.

The critter was placed into the hollowed-out marble cornerstone 
of a new courthouse in 1897, just before the cornerstone was sealed.

Then in 1928, when the old courthouse in Eastland, Tex., was 
torn down, a localbeing

N O T P R E T T Y , but one horned toad wos gue*t of a U .S. President,
, , (toads, which are hibernating I knew Will Wood had put that

p asto r w as ask ed  to f^^ch  j a b i l i t y  to toad m there, and everybody 
in and  rem o v e  the toad. Eo I survive for too years without wanted to see if it was still

air, food or water alive," said Joe Gray, 67. He
"Everybody in those parts | recalled that 2,000 people

and behold, the toad had 
not croaked — it was still 
alive!

.As word of the creature — 
nicknamed Old Rip — leap­
frogged around the country in 
screaming banner headlines, 
little Eastland was flooded 
with tourists, and President 
Calvin Coolidge even had Old 
Rip brought to the White 
House for a personal au­
dience

It all started as a playful 
stunt some 30 years earlier 
when the toad — actually an 
unusual type of lizard — was 
entombed by a young local. 
Will Wood.

He apparently wanted to 
test the legend that homed

crowded around the court­
house in February 1928 to 
watch the toad removal cere­
mony.

■•Rev. Frank E. Singleton 
reached in and pulled out the 
toad by its leg. as black as 
coal dust

"He held it up in the sun­
light and you could have 
heard a pin drop

"Everybody was just hold­
ing their breath .” said Joe 
Gray

Suddenly its leg twitched. 
Then the creature began to 
wiggle as it filled its lungs 
with huge gulps of air. A 
mighty roar rose from the 
crowd "It's  Old Rip!" yelled 
an onlooker, and the name 
stuck

tour
stop

— which In- 
at the White

pearance 
eluded a 
House.

"President Calvin Coolidge 
had the distinct honor of 
meeting Old Rip," said Hous­
ton V. O'Brien, publisher of 
the Eastland Telegram.

‘ He even broke several en­
gagements for the opportuni­
ty to meet E astland’s most 
famous resident." said the 
publisher.

Tragically, in January  1929, 
Old Rip croaked his last after 
just 11 months of freedom, the 
victim of a bout with pneu­
monia.

He lay in state for several 
days for people to pay their 
respects, and to this day 
sleeps eternally in a little blue

Both reporters and tourists I velvet casket inside a glass

Page 12 NATIONAL
INQUIRIR

O LD  RIP RESTS IN  P EA C E inside a blue velvet case in 
the lobby of the courthouse in Eastland, Tex.

flocked to Eastland Will 
Wood took the famous critter 
on a nationwide public ap-

and m arble case in the lobby 
of Eastland's courthouse.

-  JOHN COOKt

Gsco Junior Colitgt Wrongler Cheerleaders

Statistics Mean People
By Viola M. Payne

It was one of those times 
when It was hard to keep my 
mind on the Pastor’s ser­
mon. Here I sat in Church 
during the worship .service, 
yet distracted by a question I 
had been asked earlier 

Will you be Church 
Temperance Leader this 
year"’"

T em p eran ce  Leader"* 
What could a Temperance 
I,eader really do? Just make 
little speeches to the Church 
members, and get them to 
subscribe to a anti-alcohol, 
anti-narcotic information 
magazine'’

And. what good was the 
Pastor doing right now, 
preaching a sermon on how 
the human b<xly was like a 
temple, and should not be 
destroyed by harmful things 
such as a lco h o lL ik e  how 
each bottle of beer or glass of 
wine a person consumed kill­
ed a certain quota of brain 
cells We already knew all 
that. And we had all heard 
how over 50 per cent of all 
fatal accidents and 85 per­
cent of the crime is somehow 
involved with alcohol and 
drugs. And how no one pro­
fits from the use of alcohol 
except the manufacturers 
and distributors The State 
taxes collected are small in 
comparison to the amount 
spent on law enforcement, 
hospitalization, imprison­
ment, welfare and child sup­
port due to the abuse of 
alcohol

This was all so very true 
But Pastor, I thought a bit 
smugly. I believe you are 
preaching to the wrong 
crowd Which of our group is 
really tempted all that much 
to take a drink"*

And the people who need to 
know what you are saying 
probably won’t come to 
Church - and they wouldn’t 
listen to you if you went 
where they are.

So we are always com­
municating with the wrong 
group - never able to reach 
out and help young people • 
never able to stop the type of 
people who will sell anything 
to make a dollar 

Memories flitted through 
my head, tangling with the 
present-day data m the ser­
mon. I have known a lot of 
people who used alcohol • 
people I cared about. Maybe 
if I could get some of their 
stories down, someone would 
notice and decide not to take 
that first drink. Then they 
wouldn't be listed as DWI, or 
- worse still - DOA (Dead On 
Arrival). That's what almost 
happened to me, once upon a 
time, due to someone elae's 
drink...

One beautiful June after­
noon I was driving into Col­
orado City to SRp a Grand- 

, fatbig, who ysas in the

hospital .My two children, in 
the back of the car, were also 
enjoying the drive Then we 
heard a roar and a clatter, 
and saw a car bearing from 
behind - on my side of the 
highway. Obviously the 
driver did not intend to miss 
me, so I managed to whip to 
the right and let him graze 
past While I attempted to 
control my car I caught a 
glimpse of a man’s leering 
face (yes, a leering face) 
framed by an unkept mat of 
hair

His car began to weave 
from one side of the road to 
the other I managed to stop 
my car beside a deep ditch.

“That man was crazy' No, 
he was d ru n k ' Thank 
Heaven we got away from 
him!"

I finally pulled my car 
back onto the road ’ I’m 
afraid he will hit someone 
over the hills there"’

The children began to play 
a game of watching for the 
"drunk man” Then, about 
twenty minutes later, as we 
pulled to the top of a hill, we 
saw a line of cars stopped in 
front of us A D P S. officer 
waved me to place in the 
line.

"Sorry, there’s been a 
head-on collision ahead At 
least one fatality . Am­
bulances are arriving to load 
the victims”

I caught a glimpse of two 
cars rammed together, with 
parts of the vehicles flung 
outward. My eyes riveted to 
the east-bound vehicle - the 
same gray car which had 
almost run me down!

Fortunately a circle of 
people hovering around the 
v ic tim s b lo tted  out 
gruesome details for us 
Soon the am bu lances 
screamed in. We followed 
them at a distance, and 
walked into the front of the 
hospital just after they had 
unloaded

Root Memorial Hosp was 
in the midst of a terrific stir. 
There were cnes of pain, 
nurses scurrying around, 
and Doctors converging on 
the scene Incred ib ly  
enough, a man was stagger­
ing around and yelling, even 
while the Sheriff walked in 
arxl handcuffed him.

‘"That's the man who is 
supposed to have been driv­
ing on the wrong side of the 
road," I heard someone say. 
"AU Ujat's wrong with him -  
he’s drunk."

"What about the others?”
"From  the west-bound 

car? A woman is dead, 
chUdren hurt - an injured 
man. And that little boy cry­
ing for his lost dog? He has 
more to cry about than the 
dog. I’m afraid. For the 
woman who died was his

Mother."
l.ater I found, in other 

parts of the southwest, that 
this type of highway ex­
perience was all too com­
mon. But it was no more 
tragic than other aspects of 
alcoholism. 1 remember an 
individual named Paul....

Paul was a man who had 
everything - or so people 
said. He had plenty of 
money, a lovely wife named 
Mary, two children, and the 
finest cotton farm anywhere 
around He lived in a sprawl­
ing, tree-shaded home about 
ten miles out of the City, and 
there were plenty of ser­
vants to do the work on the 
farm and in the house.

Although Paul, in his ex­
pensive clothing, appeared 
aristocratic, he was actually 
a self-made man. He had 
come from a struggling 
family where his father and 
a bro ther had died of 
alcoholism. That was enough 
reason for him to stay away 
from the bars in the area, 
and he seldom touched 
alcohol Some of his wealthy 
friends, however, habitually 
gathered in bars and clubs to 
socialize.

During this time a foreign 
government was trying to in­
duce successfu l cotton 
farmers of the southwest to 
emigrate from the United 
States and set up model cot­
ton farms for demonstration 
purposes. Paul and Mary- 
made one trip to look the 
situation over, but finally 
decided against the plan

Ore -vght afterward Paul 
needed to talk to a friend 
about a business matter, and 
fially found him in a Club A 
small party was in progress, 
and drink was thrust upon 
Paul He supposed it would 
be only sociable to taste the 
m uture of brandy and te- 
quilla in his hand

Exactly how it happened 
he never knew, but he was 
soon drinking along with the 
group By closing time 
neither he or the rest of the 
citizens were in any condi­
tion to drive home.

With regular bouts at 
drinking, naturally Paul 
slacked up on his brand of 
"windshield farming" - an 
a rran g e m e n t w here he 
drove along to see if his 
foreman was keeping the 
wetbacks on the job. Oddly 
enough, the workers seemed 
to slack off in proportion to 
the drinking bouts of the land 
owner.

These came more fre­
quently, usually followed by 
Mary's accusations of how 
Paul was an alcohlic just like 
his father. Finally she decid­
ed to divorce him.

Paul described to a friend - 
later - the whole ugly cour­
troom scene.

"I went down there to stop 
this foolishness - for you 
know how I love Mary . I 
believe 1 could have stopped 
the divorce, even then, if I 
could have gotten Mary 
away from her lawyer. But 
there he was - throwing a 
bunch of legal stuff between 
us. So I gave up and walked 
out.

‘You know - sometimes I 
wish we had gone overseas 
to live. Maybe things would 
have been better there.”

Not long afterward, Paul 
took out his favorite gun and 
put a bullet through his 
brain.

Over in the same City, 
Barbara was the woman who 
had everything. Well not 
quite, for she had no husband 
or children. But with her 
charm and stunning blonde 
looks, people were certain 
she had many chances to 
marry. She wrote for large 
metropolitian newspapers, 
and was in demand for 
speaking engagements in the 
area

Finally a fellow-writer 
was describing, in detail, a 
meeting I did not attend.

"There was a cocktail 
hour before the Workshop, 
and I was surprised at how 
long Barbara lingered there. 
She m anaged  to down 
enough drinks to make her a 
little unsteady.”

’’Well m aybe th is is 
unusual for her,” I offered. 
“ I hear she has just accepted 
a position as head of a 
private school - that expen­
sive one which puts such 
stress on culture and man­
ners. She will have to be 
careful around there.”

Apparently she was not 
careful enough, for she was 
soon involved in some 
strange incident in which she 
turned in a false fire alarm 
late at night. Even the 
newspapers carried a little 
Item about that, and the 
rumors around town in­
dicated Barbara was drunk 
at the time Soon she was 
discreetly eased from her 
position.

What becomes of an 
alcoholic who tries to cling to 
an intellectual level"* This 
brilliant person ran through 
at least one college pro­
fessorship before she left the 
southwest. For alcohol is no 
respecter of intellect.

Perhaps Martin was not 
the most intellectual man 
around, but he was cer- 
tamally well balanced and 
practical He needed tius 
practicability, for his ranch 
had Its quota of deep, highly 
productive oil wells.

Not that the oil had made 
too much difference in .Mar­
tin’s life style. And he had 
raised his only child • a 
daughter named Betty • in 
the concerned fashion of a 
widower father who also at­
tempted to take the place of 
a mother. Ixwely Betty was 
his joy • his reason for living 
- no doubt about that.

While Betty was growing 
up she had seen her father 
take a drink of alcohol now 
and then. He had explained 
to her that it was alright to 
drink socially, but a person 
should never, never drink

too much. And only weak 
and stupid people ever 
became drunk.

Then there came a Satur­
day night Martin had to be 
away on business. He hated 
that, for Betty had a date for 
Saturday night, and he 
always liked to be in the 
house to see her off. But 
maybe he was too old- 
fashioned - Betty was a 
trustworthy girl.

It was around midnight 
that Saturday night when the 
Police finally reached Mar­
tin with the unbelievable 
news. Both Betty and her
date for the evening had

been killed in a grinding, 
one-car crash. The only 
possible explanation was 
that the alcoholic content of 
the young couple’s blood had 
been high.

For the next few days Mar­
tin struggled with the terri­
ble details of the burial of his 
daughter. As he moved 
about in a daze, questions of 
why and how kept rushing 
through the fog. Betty and 
her date couldn’t have been 
gone from the house long 
before the accident - not long 
enough to stop in a bar and 
drink that much.

At last Martin was alone in

his house, feeling the desola­
tion seep through all his 
material things. He suppos­
ed there was only one way to 
dull his senses - go to the 
cabinet and get a shot of 
whiskey.

He opened the cabinet, 
then draw back. For instead 
of the bottle of whiskey in its 
usual place, there lay a note.

"D ad,” it said, “ John 
forgot his bottle, so we are 
borrowing yours. Betty.”

I jerked myself back to the 
present. I was missing most 
of the Pastor’s sermon, 
while thinking of these sad 
stories. And the bad part was

that I knew many more 
stories to add to these.

But the worship service 
was over. Time to file out to 
the world we live in • a world 
of problems and people. God 
was concerned about all 
these people. How much 
were we?

I shook the Pastor's hand. 
I couldn’t say I had enjoyed 
his sermon! But I did say 
something else.

"Pastor, you know what 
you asked me • about being a 
Temperance Leader this 
year? I don’t know what I 
can do. Pastor, but I ’ll try to 
do something.”

FAMILY-SIZE 
STORAGE IN

REFRIGERATOR / FREEZERS
DESIGNED FOR DEPENDABLE PERFORMANCE 

AND ENERGY EFFICIENCY

See these big capacity 
Am ana refrigerator/freezers today!

• WALL-TO-WALL REFRIGERATOR SHELVES GLIDE OUT FOR EASY ACCESS TO BACK ITEMS
• SMOKEY SEE-THROUGH MEAT PAN AIDS FRESH MEAT STORAGE

• FAST-FREEZE FREEZER SHELF FREEZES FOOD QUICKLY

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY
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Ugbts from the 
Cbístiaii Wwld

I By: Josephine Cleveland
“A wlM man ia atrong; 

yea, a man of knowledge in* 
c r e a s e t h  
strength. "-Proverba 24;S 

An old blacksmith lived in 
the heart of a village. All day 
long people could hear the 
clanging of his hammer upon 
the anvil. They knew he was 
forging a chain. Now and 
then idlers dropped in to 
w atch his work. They 
observed how faithful and 
patient he was and how he

would never pass over a link 
until it was perfect.

“Why are you spending so 
much time on the chain 
link?" his neighbors asked. 
“You would get more ac­
complished and make a bet­
ter living for yourself if you 
spent less time on each 
link."

The old blacksmith only 
shook his head and kept on 
doing his best. He made 
every link as strong as if the

Morren’s Güt Shop 
24 hr. Service

5 days a week
on KodacoW D

&
Ektachrome Slides
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whole chain depended upon 
it.

Eventually the old man 
died. The great chain found 
its way to a ship. An anchor 
was attached to it. Someone 
coiled up the chain and plac­
ed it in an out of the way 
place-forgotten.

A raging storm arose 
while the ship was making 
an ocean voyage. The rain 
fell in torrents and waves 
lashed against the ship. It 
took several men at the helm 
to guide her. Someone notic­
ed the old chain. They quick­
ly lowered the anchor. As it 
sank into the ocean depth, 
the chain grew taut and stiff 
as a bar of iron. Would it 
hold?

Beloved, the faithful old 
smith had done his work 
well. When the waves stilled 
and the sun appeared, the 
vessel with all its precious 
lives and cargo was safe.

Friend, link by link, hour 
by hour, you are fashioning a 
chain. When temptations 
come, it will test your work. 
One weak spot and you can 
be wrecked by that one im­
perfect link.

It need not be so. Be 
faithful! Keep your eyes on 
the One who provides you 
strength to withstand temp­
tations. Your anchor will 
hold!

Josephine Cleveland may 
be contacted by writing P.O. 
Box 591, Cisco, Texas 76437.

FOR SALE: 19M Ford 
L a r ia t  S uper-cab  
pickup, red and white,
11.000 miles.

1M9 Ford Ranger Pu.,
88.000 miles. Depen­
dable and clean.

Bay Mare, good stock 
horse.

Cedar Stays 
Contact: J r  Chambers 

817-25944S3 
WlUiams Vicinity 

30-ltc

T-74

New Daily Bullet 
Starting Thursday

$395
Honrs: 11 a.m. to 2 p.m. 
Thursday thru Sunday 

Elephant Room 
of the

White Elephant Restaurant 
Interstate 20 East Cisco. P-76

Morgan Building Corp. needs a few 
really good people in key jobs. We build 
buildings in a manufacturing environmant.

We have an all-weather facility and 
full time work.

We need people in the following areas:
•k Assembly line workers 

★  Liners
★  Plumbers

★  Electricians
We offer 6 paid holidays, paid vacations, 
and group insurance. Apply in person, 

Morgan Building Corp.
Hwy 69 North 

Eastland, Taxas 
E.O.E.

Large Crowd Attends 
Angus Field Day

THE BUNBOW EXPBESS
1 0 1 2  W . M a in

OPENING THURSDAY 
SEPTEMBER 10

Toys For All Ages 
Open Tnes. thru Sat. 10:00 til 5:00

A large crowd attended the 
annual field day of the Leon 
Valley Angus Association 
which was held Saturday, 
August 29, at the Heyser 
Angus Ranch in Cisco. 
Guests registered from Lub­
bock, Fort Worth, Richland 
Springs, Abilene and many 
from  the S tephenville-

G sco Club 
Hosts GoH 
Scramble

The Cisco Country Club 
will host a Scramble Match- 
Play Partnership golf tour­
nament on September 12 and 
13. Matches will be played on 
Saturday morning, Saturday 
afternoon, and Sunday after­
noons by each team. The en­
try fee is $35.00 per team and 
there will be c a ^  prizes.

Contact Bobby Smith at 
442-1512, Cisco, or Cisco 
Country Club to enter. A 
qualifying round must be 
played prior to September 
12.

Pleasant Hill 
Homecoming 
Sept. 13th
The annual Pleasant Hill 

Homecoming will be Sun­
day, September 13, at the 
P le a sa n t Hill B ap tis t 
Church. Registeration will 
be at 10.

Dr. Leon Woods, the 
p as to r, will bring  the 
message, and the special 
music will be by Jimmy 
Myers, the song director, 
and Don Nicholas. Mrs. 
Charlie Livingston is the 
pianist.

Everyone is invited to the 
Homecoming Service and 
the basket lunch at noon.

■See M.H. Perry for 
GROUP INSURANCE 

629-1566 or 629-1096 
104 N. Lamar-East land

Brown wood area.
Everyone enjoyed coffee 

and donuts upon arrival.
After registration a cattle 

Judging contest was held.
Winners in the contest were:
Ladies D ivision-Patricia 
Hall of Fort Worth with Bet­
ty Kidd of Eastland as 
runner-up. Four-bull weight 
guessing contest winner was 
Jan Brokaw of Abilene 
Men’s division-Tol Thomas 
of Lubbock with Robert Gorr Cisco.

Courthouse Report
Court of Appeals

of Cisco as runner-up. Four- 
bull weight guessing contest 
winner was Major Farn­
sworth Cisco.

Eh. Leon Woods brought 
the invocation before a lunch 
of barbecue brisket and all 
the trimmings was served. 
After lunch Eastland County 
Ag Extension Agent De Mar­
quis Gordon brought a most 
in fo rm ativ e  lec tu re  on 
Brucellosis in cattle herds.

The next meeting of the 
Association will be held the 
first Monday in Decmeber at 
the Colony Restaurant in

Motions Submitted
5600 Euramerica Corpora­

tion V. Euramerica 1972 
Partnership et al. Applica­
tion for temporary injunc­
tion. Nolan

5600 Euramerica Corpwa- 
tion V . Euram erica 1972 
Partnership et al. Motion to 
give priority of hearing to 
application for temporary 
injunction. Nolan

5626 James P. Bailey v. 
William R. Travis. Ap­
pellant’s motion for rehear­
ing. Travis

5665 Louis Stevenson et al 
V. Betty Frances Tice. Ap­
pellants’ motion for perma­
nent withdrawal of exhibits 
and transcript. Taylor

5679 Colorado Independent 
School Distict V. Valero 
Transmission Company. Ap­
pellant’s motion for exten­
sion of time to file Statement 
of Facts. Mitchell

5680 The Bank of Woodson 
V. Susie Hibbitts. Appellant’s 
motion to extend time for fil­
ing transcript. Throckmor­
ton.

5680 The Bank of Woodson 
V. Susie Hibbitts. Appellee’s 
motion for dismissal of ap­
peal. Throckmorton.
Motions Granted

5665 Louis Stevension et al 
V. Betty Frances Tice. Ap-

AUCTION
Saturday Soptombar 12,1981 

10 AM

pellsnts’ motion for nerma- 
nent withdrawal of exhibits 
and transcript. Taylor

5679 Colorado Independent 
School District v. Valero 
Transmission Comapny. Ap­
pellant’s motion for exten­
sion of time to file Statment 
of Facts. Mitchell

5680 'The Bank of Woodson 
V. Susie Hibbits. Appellant’s 
motion to extend time for fil­
ing transcript. Throckmor­
ton.
Motions Dismissed 

5600 Euramica Corpora­
tion V . Euram erica 1972 
Partnership et al. Applica­
tion for temporary injunc­
tion. Nolan
5600 Euramerica Corpora­
tion V. Euram erica 1972 
Partnership et al. Motion to 
give priority of hearing to 
appliction for temporary in­
junction. Nolan 
Motions Overruled 

5625 James P. Bailey v. 
William R. Travis. Ap­
pellant’s motion for rehear­
ing. Travis

5680 'The Bank of Woodson 
V. Susie Hibbitts. Appellee’s 
motion for dismissal of ap­
peal. Throckmorton.
Case Submitted 

5677 Mary Jane Birdwell v. 
Mike A. Smiddy, County 
Judge et al. Palo Pinto

Git-e 
Somebody \ 
A  Ghost!

— mHM Wont of StophonvUla, Toxaa
(Fitxn SlopiMnvWo City HmHs take Highway 
877 Waat 1.1 mNo, turn right on Stophon- 
vNlo LandfW Road, go 1.5 mUos, turn right .8 
mUo. foUow AUCTION MONS)

coowian uowoA'noN of aoaeaTSON's constouction  com fanv . 
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Up «aal Anal» lOi««

A  Different Gift!

If you followed 
j"Off The Beaten Trail" 
or any other Syers' 
best seller. . .

You'll want the

GHOST 
STORIES 
of Texas.^

 ̂Ì
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Thursday, Septembar 10, 1981
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Newspaper Seeks To 
Feoture Young People

Since our young people are an important pait 
of Eastland County, the newspapers wish to 
feature articles about them. Informatimi is need­
ed on all young people - those at C.J.C., Ranger, 
and Colleges and Universities elsewhere. Please 
call in their names to the Eastland Telegram or 
your local newspaper, with their places of atten­
dance, College majors, and what they hope to do 
in the future. This information will be c<»npiled 
and published soon.

'RiD'S TEXACO & CAR CARE C
iasf 1-201 Hwy 80 

629-8B9S
01A fíhér Air CoHétium

7un0-Up
Ivbrkathn Mirto topoir

Froo Pickup & Road Sorvko Wifhm 5 mdos 
Frod Povohomo

Canô
LOA» PRODOCTIOIC REAL EETATS

Just on Market : 9.362 Ac with nice mobile home. 42 pro­
ducing pecans. CALL FOR DETAIL.

NEED A GROWING BUSINESS: Nice Modem 
Restaurant in good location. Doing a booming 
business.

2 ^  AC & NEW HOME: 1300 sq. ft. 3 bedroom 2 bath 
Total electric. Gorman. Nice Home.

Your Business Is Our Pleasure.

CCifflîîI ¡.CM irRTICt 
( b l 7 )  67V -»53V Lm ic*

____________,

:AS31 ::IKL. Iraner 
m: Wc: i Hair, artei 
laailand. Tx. ?N4I

Phon« S3»44tC HwtrMU. Tn a i

O V EB STO C IB D  
BUILDII8 U n S IA L S  

ATAIUBLB
AT WHOLESALE PBICBSI 

WDlitantiintd litarlur Ptiit~f ttlart 
JtYillikli lorm il lOW
IwwTlBSI OTIIR ITIHI ALIO 

Af AILABLI AT 110 lA f l lO I -
★  IxttrUr Ani Intirlur Duuri 

★  WlBdowi ikltrdwtrt
WOlmuBiluotl iBBibtr—1X4 I I I  tXI

★  lU etritil lappllti ^iBitrplBBlBg 
■Â PlBBihlBg iBppliti Ab4 lixtBrui

★  Plywuod—Vii” bb4 %** 
l^Xtrihotri IUIbi Puiti

WltMl IldlBg IBi RtUllBg
★  ■B6h Hurt

OptB 7:11 ta i:tO HoBAiy-ThBriAty
M HOROAI BUILDIIO CORP.
! Iw f II lorth ItitUBd, Ttxti 7Af/

ORDER BY MAIL
Texan Press 
P.O Boi I«S4 

Wico, Texss 71702 
Plessc send me the lollowing 
copies of GHOST STOXItS 
of Texas:

Hard Bound si $10 9$
each
(Include t1 W  l.c p o u .g r  S  
Kjndling I

NAM C____________________

ADOOtSS_________________

C IT Y _____________________

S T A T I _ jrip-
Make check or m one, otdet pn^ahle 

to Tesun  Prese

Offered as a 
public service by

EasUgud Telegram
!■

Snapper Tractor

SUPER BONUS DAYS
FREE Snapper attachments. Save up to $1000.

VAC-N-PAC
CATCHCR

Purchase any SNAPPER Garden 
Tracior and 'eceis’e up to SICXX) 
worth ot SNAPPER attachments 
FREE Visit your neighborhood 
SNAPPER rlealer today and let 

SNAPr%R solve 
your grow-

FRONT
DOZER BLADE

‘229“

FRONT L  
SNOWTHROWBR

‘939*

GARDEN TOOL K IT

‘539*

M P*m.Cll>ATISiODf » lin A iIN lv SNAPPER
V E R S A T IL E  VALU E

omt CND$ SIPTIMilR 10

Foster Sales & Service
________________1305 Ava. De Gico 442-17SI_________________



Changes For Registration 
Of Livestock Brands
Attorney General Mark 

White has issued two At­
torney General’s opinions 
which affect and should in­
terest everyone involved in 
the cattle, ranching, farming 
and dairy mdustnes. Opi­
nion MW-289 discusses cer­
tain changes in laws on the 
reg istration  of livestock 
brands, and MW-368 further 
clarifies the statutes.

Article 6899j, V.T C.S was 
passed by the l.egislature 
and became effective on 
August 30, 1971. Under this 
law and under Article 6890, 
V.T.C.S., all marks and 
brands reg istered  after 
August 30, 1971 and before 
August 30, 1981 must be re­
registered w ithin SIX months 
of the latter date Marks and 
brands must then be re­
registered at subsequent ten- 
year intervals by the owner. 
Ml marks and brands will 
then be recorded with the 
county clerk, regardless of 
when they originally were 
recorded, within six months 
of August 30,1981, August 30, 
1991, August 30, 2001, etc.

Attorney General Mark 
White is reminding every

citizen who has registered a 
brand prior to August 30, 
1981 that citizens must re­
register each brand with the 
county clerk within six mon­
ths in order to protect their 
right to it. If everyone 
follows the reg istra tion  
schedule set out by the law, 
county clerks will have a 
co rrec t, revised set of 
records every ten years, and 
there should be no dispute 
about the correct ownership 
of livestock.

To register or re-register 
m arks and brands, the 
livestock owner may obtain 
forms either by mail or in 
person from his or her coun­
ty clerk’s office. There will 
be blank spaces on the form 
in which to describe the 
mark or band and the loca­
tion on the animal where the 
brand is recorded. The 
forms should be mailed or 
delivered in person to the 
county clerk, who will keep 
the forms in an indexed bond 
volume or microfilm for 
easy reference

Opinion .MW-358 answers 
questions concerning the 
recording of the marks and 
brand and publication re­

quirements to notify the 
public of changes in the law. 
Under Article 6899j, the 
county clerk is not required 
to notify individual owners of 
cattle brands of the ten-year 
expiration date of their 
registration. However, the 
county clerk must publish 
notice of the registration 
date in a newspaper of 
general circulation in the 
county for a period of thirty 
days, paying for such notice 
of the general county fund 
Finally, when the clerk 
records the brands or 
marks, the date of record 
must be noted.

Attorney General Mark 
White and his office will be 
glad to answer any further 
questions on this matter. In­
terested persons should call 
512/475-2501 for more infor­
mation, or write to the At­
torney General at P.O. Box 
12548, Austin. Texas 78711.

Square Donee 
Sat. Sept. 12th

Cross Plains area square 
dancers will host a square 
dance Sat. 12 of Sept. 8:00 un­
til 11:00 at the Cross Plains 
multi-purpose center.

Ralph McMullen of Baird 
will be calling. All area 
dancers are invited to join 
us.

Beware of Pantry Insect Pests
Several kinds of insects 

can be expected in the 
homemaker’s kitchen pan­
try at one time or another.

Insects can get into the 
cleanest of kitchens in any 
one of several ways. This 
group of insects includes

roaches, ants, saw-tooth 
grain beetles, Indian-meal 
and M editerranean flour 
m oths, confused flour,

c igarette  and drugstore 
beetles, amd rice, bean, and
cowpea weevils.

Organization For Fair 
Concession Stands Needed

Ceiling Fans at Beil Draperies
Large Selection in S t o c k _  25% OFF

Come
iiSU'i

^L [/ Models on Display
Beil D raperies. 1706 W. Commerce. Eastland. 629-1319

F r o m  *8 9 ® «  U p

The Eastland County Fair 
Association is seeking an 
organization within the coun­
ty to sponsor the concession 
stands at the County Fair on 
October 1,2, and 3. For the 
first time since the Fair’s 
begmning, the concenssion 
stands profits will be divided 
between the Fair Associa­
tion and the sponsoring 
organization. The sponsor­
ing organization would 
receive 60% of the net profit 
while the Fair Association

Retired 
Teachers To 
Meet tept.14

Retired teachers of Gor­
man will host the first 
meeting of the new year for 
the Eastland County Retired 
Teachers Association on 
Monday, September 14, at 
the Senior Citizens’ Center 
on Main Street in Gorman, at 
2:30.

Interesting programs have 
been planned for the year, 
and it is hoped that every 
retired teacher of the county 
will join the ranks of many 
other retired teachers of 
T exas in becom ing a 
member of the local and 
state organizations.

Come on. R e tired  
Teachers of Eastland Coun­
ty, and be counted!

Majestic Theatre
One Showing Only Each Evening 

Open 7:30 p.m. Showtime 7;50 p,^ni^

STARTS THURSDAY...

Ronger

DRIVE - IN
t h e a t r e

647-3802
One Showing Only Each Evening 

Open 8:00 p.m . Showtime 8 :30  p.m .

Thursday, Friday, 
Saturday, Sunday

Richard Pryor 
Cicely Tyson 

in
♦r/«- '

Bustin'
Loose
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receiving 40%. This would be 
an excellent money-raising 
activity for any club or 
group.

The major responsibilities 
of the sponsoring group 
would be purchasing all food 
and supplies needed to 
operate  the concession 
stands fdf3 days and also to 
provide workers to man the 
concession stands at all 
times.

Any organizations in­
terested in operating the 
concession stands may con­
tact the County Extension 
Office at 629-2222 or 629-1093. 
The deadline for bidding on 
the s tan d s  is F rid ay , 
September 11.

Single
Adult
Bible

'These inneots may be in 
the larvae or adult stage and 
may all produce similar 
damage and require similar 
control measures.

Some pantry pests are 
general feeders and will con­
sume nearly all types of 
vegetable and animal n u t­
te r  while o th ers  have 
definite food prefernces and 
will confine themselves to 
those preferences. A few of 
the many food items that at­
tra c t pan try  pests are 
chocolate and nut meats, 
m acaroni and spaghetti, 
breakfast cereals, certain 
drugs, spices and tobacco, 
caynne pepper, powdered 
milk, and dried peas and 
beans.

Feeds should be purchased 
in quantities small enough to 
be used rapidly and if 
storage is necessary, they 
should be stored in glass, 
plastic or metal containers 
with tight fitting lids. Discar­
ding small quantities of In­
fested foods rather than at­
tempting to salvage them 
with freezing and heating 
techniques.

Study Come Study With 
New Ftiends

Sundays 9:45».m.
First Baptist Church
Educational Building 

on Plummer 
Eastland

PUBLIC NOTICE
B R IE F  EXPLAN ATO RY STA TEM EN TS OF PRO PO SED

CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS
SPECIAL ELECTION  
NOVEMBER 3. 1981

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT
Senate Joint Kesnlution 

8 proposes a constitution­
al amendment that would 
allow the legislature to 
authorize cities, towns 
and other ta.xinit units to 
grant exi-mptions from ad 
valorem taxes on an un­
productive, underdevel­
oped or blighted area in 
order to encourage its de­
velopment. The amend­
ment would also allow the 
legislature to authorize a 
city or town to issue 
bonds or notes to finance 
this development and to 
pledge future increases in 
ad valorem tax re\enues 
from the propert\ in suvli 
areas to repay these 
bonds or notes.

The proposed amend­
ment Will appear on the 
ballot as follows: "The 
constitutional amend­
ment to authorize cities, 
towns, and other taxing 
units to entouiage the 
improvement, ilevelop- 
ment, or redevelopment 
of certain ureas through 
property tax lehef and 
the issuance of bonds 
and notes. '

PKUP()>rriON NO. 2 
ON THE RVLLOl
House Joint Kesuluiion 

117 proposes a constitu­
tional amendment that 
would authorize a per.-uii 
to recei\e a patent to land 
from the t. ommis.-ionei of 
the Ueneial Lund Office 
under certain conditions. 
.Application lor the patent 
must be n.atle within five 
\ears from approral of 
the amendment. The land 
must lie surveyed, public 
fiee school lard not jire- 
\iouily patentable. 1 he 
per.-on must hare a prop- 
eily re oided need to the 
land, which he acijuiied 
without knowledge of the 
patent uefect and which 
title he and his piedcces- 
.sors in interest hare held 
for at lea.«t .7<i reals. The 
person and his predeces­
sors in interest must 
hare continuously claimed 
the land and paid the 
taxes for at lea-t .i'l .rears.

This amendment does 
not apply to U a. 1: lami, 
submerged land, or is­
lands. .\n applicant may 
not uae thit provision to

resolve a ooundary dis­
pute. Thii. amendment 
rvill iiol apply to land 
rvhich has been deter­
mined to be state-orvned 
by a court of competent 
jurisdiction or that has a 
produc'ive state mineral 
lease on tin ■ ffertivp ilate 
of the amendment.

The proposed amend­
ment will appi'ar on the 
balloi as follorvs: “The 
coii.'tiiutional amend­
ment inithoiizing the 
coimni.'sioin'r of the 
Ceneiiil Laml Office to 
issue patents for cer­
tain public free school 
fund land held in good 
faith uinb i color of title 
for at li .')il rears as 
of N'orembei l.'i, ItlKl.“

l'R (M M > 's||H » N  O .
i MK r m .i .ah

llou-e Joint Kesolution
:th propii.--cs a constitu­
tional amendment that 
rvould enable the legisla- 
tuii- to grant to a state 
finance manag'Oi ent com­
mittee the aothoritr to 
manage .--late funds. 
I'unds constitutionally 
dedicated to specific pur- 
po.ses rrould not, be sub­
ject to cuinniittee niun- 
ageiim'it I be 1 ommittee 
rroulo be con.p.i.'id of the 
tiort-inoi, I.ieuli iiunt (lov- 

.■■peusei of the 
id' Ki presi-ntatires, 

it thi' .'̂ elt-

eriior, 
Houm 
t hairi 
ate

nan 
•'inance ( 'miriiittee, 

t haiinian of tlie House 
ppropiiation- I iimmil- 

tee. I hairmun of the .Seii- 
av .''la'' .Mfai's i oni- 
inilti I', and th*- I huinnan 
of the Hou.'*' of Hepre-
M l i l a t i r e s  W u v . s and

A regular general cleanup 
of the storage area is recom­
mended whether the food is 
kept or discarded. Cabinets 
should be washed and the 
shelves covered with foil or 
paper and the foods replac­
ed.

There is no need to 
fumigate the entire house to 
control pantry pests. More 
in fo rm atio n  ab o u t all 
household insects may be 
found in the “Texas Guide 
for Controlling Household In­
sects” which is avialable at 
the County Extension Office.

Thursday, 
S#pt«nrib«r 10, Ì9EG1

E A S T L A N D  /  
C O U N T Y

HOLLIS W IL L IM S  

CONSTRUCTION

Residential and commtrcial. 

Remodelini, add-ons, ntw 

homes, custom cabinets, con- 

crotc, electrical work, tic. 

442 1933, Cisco. p-SStfc

LOAN PR0DÜ6TI0I & REAL ESTATE
::v.n:î: icai smvici

(bl7) 6ZV-»bJV OMtCH
:5:‘: c:3-i:63 ttes.

CAKCL SCICIL. Irokcr 
:c; Wc:i Hair. Stmt 
::5:lar.i!. Tx. *6B8

Take AVLfeekend 
g- Rmily Vacation y

(w ithout toAng f*r).
Klva li>n H VKSMd AbUona i Inn Door R«ori 

or Family FUn all yoeW long* WKhin th* gionl
b*aulitully landicapod afrium cllmal* 
ooniroUad tot total comlorl a world at acUvHy 
unloldi b*lor* your *y*i Th* diHtnclN* bland ol 
a luxury hoi*l and raaorl tatting oOan you ih* ban 
or avarylhing in Wan Tazea without going tar

• Hs and Han Saunas
• Putting Sraan
• Ezaicii* Araa
•  Hydro-Spa Whirlpool

• Childrant Ploy Arao
•  ixom* liooin
• Two Rottouranli 
a Uniqu* Cocktail

Loung*

Luxury Guasf Room 
and Suit** with 
Spociol AppomBnanls 
Indoor <sxl Outdoor

Two AU'Waolhar 
Surlac* Tanrus CourU

^ M P ln n
MOTOR HOTEL

Hwy (to Wat Abiiana Tazas 9IS096-2IS0 
For Ratarvaliont Call I OOOS02 4406

Mi-ali' ( uminiUei'.
The piujio-eil ameiid- 
im-nt will appeal' on 
the lialb't a ' f'lllow.s: 
"1 he (lm^’itulional 

ameii'lmeiit t" allow 
the legi.-lutuie to grant 
t') a 'ta le  If 'le man­
agement eomri..Uee the 
power to manage the 
expenditure of certain 
appropriated funds”

|•B^I*OM  n O N  NO. 
ON THE I lM .I .n r
Hnii-e Joint IteNolunun 

8 pii>|Hisefl a constitutioniil 
uniendment that would 
proMde that one-half of 
the surplus tax revenues

above the spending limit 
provided by Article V lll, 
Section 22. of the Texas 
Constitution would be 
placed in a Water Assis­
tance Fund to be used as 
provided by law, includ­
ing projects for water de­
velopment anil conserva­
tion, water quality en­
hancement, and flood 
control purposes or any 
combination of these pur­
poses.

The amendment also 
provides $500,00(1,000 of 
the general credit of the 
state to guarantee bonds 
issued in commercial mar­
kets by local political sub­
divisions, ineluiling cities, 
counties, and sficcial dis­
tricts. The amendment al­
lows amounts to be es­
tablished to decrease or 
i-etire stale debt, which is 
defined as that debt se­
cured by the full faith 
and credit of the state. 
The amendment would 
raise the interest that 
could be paid on autho­
rized, but unissued, bonds 
guaranteed by the full 
faith and credit of the 
stale from (i'< to 12'». 

The proposed anienil- 
ment w ill appear on the 
ballot as follow.': “’Ihe 
constitutional umeinl- 
mtnt authorizing the 
use of u portion of the 
excess revenues of the 
state for water devel­
opment, water conser­
vation, water quality 
enhancement, and flood 
control purposes; au- 
thoi'izing the u.se of the 
state’s credit, not to 
exceed five hundred 
million dollars, to guai- 
anlee the bonds of ci­
ties, countii's, towns, 
and other units of local 
government in the fi­
nancing of projects for 
such purposes; iiicieas­
ing the in'eresl rale 
that may be paid on 
previously approved, 
but unis.'ueil, state 
bonds; and authorizing 
a program to retire 
state iKJtids.”

l*K()l*OSITION NO .> 
tJN THE IIM.LOT
House Joint Kesolution 

19 projiuses a constitution­
al amendment that would 
exempt livestock and 
poultry from taxation, 
rurrently, farm products 
in the hands of the pro­
ducer and family supplies 
for home and farm use 
are exempt.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows: "The 
constitutional amend­
ment to provide for the 
inclusion of livestock 
and poultry with farm 
products as exempt 
from taxation.”

PROPOSITION NO. b 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Resolution

81 authorizes the govern­
ing body of a county, city, 
school district or other 
political aulidivisions to 
exempt from taxation a 
portion of the market 
value of a residence 
homestead. The portion 
exempted may be as 
much as 40'^ for 1982- 
1981; for 1985-1987;
and 20'; for 1988 and af­
ter. The amount of an 
exemption may not be 
less than $5,000 unless 
the legi.slature by general 
law prescribes other 
monetary restrictions on 
the amount pf the exemp­
tion. An eligible adult is 
allowed to receive other 
applicable e.xemptions 
provided by law. .An ex­
ception is made where ad 
valorem tax has previous­
ly been pledged for the 
payment of debt.

The amendment further 
directs the legislature to 
require that notice Ik; giv­
en to properly owners of 
a n'U.soiiuble estimate of 
tux on their property in 
cerluiii situations.

1 tie firup'iseil amend- 
nieiit will appear on the 
ballot as follows: "The 
constitutional umend- 
meiil authorizing a po­
litical subdivision to 
(irovide proiierty tax 
relief for owners of 
residence homesteads 
and changing certain 
pro|H'ity tax admini­
strative procedures.”

PBOPOMTIOIv NO. 7 
ON THE BALLOT
House Joint Kesolution 

t iiropnses a constitution­
al amendment that would 
authorize the Veterans' 
t.and Hoard to issue and 
si'll un additional $250,- 
0(Mi,i)(»(i in bonds increas­
ing the Veterans’ Land 
Fund's tota< l>ond ia- 
suance authorization from 
$700,000,000 to $950,000,- 
(ttio. The amendment 
would increase the maxi­
mum interest payable by 
the state on these bonds 
from ()'; to 10',i, and 
permit an even higher 
rate, if specified by the 
legislature.

The proposed amend­
ment will appear on the 
ballot as follows; "The 
constitutional amend­
ment authorising the 
issuance of additional 
lx>nds to finance the 
veterans’ land program 
and to increase the 
maximum interest rate 
allowable on veterans’ 
land fund bonds.”

i
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COWBOYS

By Richard

The Dallas Cowboys beat 
their division rivals at 
Washington Redskins 26 to 10 
in their seventeenth con­
secutive opening game win.

The Cowboy offense show­
ed a good running game with 
im proved  backs Tony 
Dorsett and Ron Springs 
starting. The line blocked 
well with Kurt Petersen 
substituting for guard Tom 
Rafferty, who has a sever ley 
pulled calf muscle. Petersen 
is still learning but is ex­
pected to be an excellent 
guard in time.

Substitute fullback Tom 
Newsome is still injured with
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Mobile Shrimp Market Will Be Àt
<w ^  w

Gibson's Discount Center One Day Only. ; 
Friday, September 11,9 g.m. to btOO p . m . :

5 Pound Box Smoll Boiling Shrimp 1̂9̂
5 Pound Box lorge Boiling Shrimp '25®®

3 Pound Box lorge Brooded Shirmp'12”
3 Pound Box Jumbo Breaded Shrimp 'ló'®

King Crab Legs '5®® Pound
____________Frog Legs'3“  Pound__________

Plus Assorted Seafood Products

cracked riba, but could 
poaaibly play before long 
with a flak jacket.

The line la the strength of 
the defense which held 
Washington to ten points 
with the aid of four intercep­
tions by the secondary. Both 
free agent rookie backs, 
starting, safety Mike Downs 
and cornerback Everson 
Walls, who doesn’t have 
great speed but makes the 
right moves, made intercep­
tion along with Benny 
Barnes and Ennis Thurman, 
who ran his back 96 yards. 
Thurman seems to often 
play beyond his ability.

Downs was injured on his 
interception return with a 
pulled hamstring spasm but 
is listed as probable for Sun- 
d a y ’s gam e a t T exas 
Stadium against the St. 
Louis Cardinals.

Also injured in the game, 
s ta r t in g  s tro n g sid e  
linebacker Mike Hegman, 
who has been playing well, 
has a f ra c tu re d  righ t 
forearm. Hegman will have 
surgery with a rod being 
placed in the arm and will be 
out from four to six weeks. 
There will probably be an 
announcement that he has 
been placed on injured 
reserve and has been replac­
ed on the team by another 
linebacker this week. Since 
the la s t  two rookie 
linebackers cut by the 
Cowboys were Scott Pelleur 
and Angelo King and Pelleur 
was picked up by the Saints, 
King may be recalled by the 
Cowboys.

Hemgan's injury has given 
Guy Brown, his replacement 
as a starter, an opportunity 
to prove himself. He will pro-

4-H Adult Leodtri Meet
Cisco “ Good T im es 

Gang” , Gorman and Rising

bably either become a very 
good starter or be replaced 
next year.

Coach Tom Landry, who 
says that his offense was 
stopped mostly only by its 
own mistakes, says that they 
will c o n c e n tra te  on 
eliminating mistakes such 
as having twleve men on the 
field.

The Cardinals will be us­
ing their rookie quarterback, 
as starter Jim Hart is in­
jured.

The game will be on TV in 
Dallas, but C.B.S. is not giv­
ing local stations the choice 
of carrying it.

S ta r  4>H Clubs w ere 
rep resen ted  a t the bi­
monthly meeting of the 4-H 
Adults Leaders Association. 
Rex Long, newly elected 
chairman, presided over the 
meeting. Each club respond­
ed to the roll call by telling of 
its summer 4-H activities.

Two representatives of the 
association will represent 
our county at the District 
Leaders Extravaganza in 
October. The leaders decide 
to make a scrapbook exhibit 
promoting the E astland 
County Wildlife Field Day 
for the Extravaganza.

It was also decided that 
the Adult Leaders Associa­
tion would sponsor up to a 
925 prize for the annual 4-H 
Spirit Contest the month of

October.
G orm an 4-H lead e rs  

reported on the program of 
the County Awards Banquet 
to held in their conmiumty 
on October 10. Adult leaders 
were assigned various parts 
on the banquet script.

Members attending the 
Association meeting were 
Don Laminack, Phil add 
Sandra Osborne, Rex and 
Trudy Long, Barbara Long, 
Kathy Hall, Jane Ray and 
Extension Agent Donna 
White.
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Vf* Mllat Nortfi of Corbon
Qi..On Hwy. 6

I Plioiia: 639-2426 
fWe Work on Amoricon ond 
llniportod Cars and Trucks

WE WOULD LIKE FOR ALL 
OF OUR FRIENDS AND CUSTOMERS

To Come 
For Our Annual 

No Money Down
LAY-A-WAY

CASH! CASH!CASH!
MONEY IN YOUR POCKETS QUICK.

Do you have an extra pickup or car around you don't really 
need'’ If you do you’re losing money every day! Don’t sell or 
trade your pickup or car away for nothing - get our offer 
before you deal! Chevrolets and Fords preferred - but will 
consider any make or model 1954 through 1974 that’s clean 
and good running - with current license and sticker. Extra 
premium paid on small V-8’s and 6 Cyl’s. and 2 drs. The 
cleaner they are the more we will pay! No clunkers or rusted- 
out junkers at any price please! ABSOLUTELY BY PHONE 
APPOINTMENT ONLY! Don’t just drive out and find me 
gone - save gas - phone Rising Star (817) 645-1372, best early 
mornings or late evening. tl05

NO MONEY O O W N -N O  CARRVINC C H A R O E S - 
MAKE YOUR 1ST PAYMENT WITHIN 30 DAYS

Perryt h «  tn  juoitm ftit ot l» 9* »OV* D«"*'
B tcyc l« . W»9om , D«*k Sou «od mooy many o th« itom« ... Bo 
WiM L»y A w iy  now ¥»hil« our leUction is goodi

SHOP EARLY t  LAYAWAY FOR CHRISTMAS

COME ON INI!

Fall Fashion Sal©
Super savings for 
back-to-school.

20% Off
all junior 
shirts and 
denims.

Sale 10.40
Reg. $13. Plaid poly/cotton 
shirt for juniors’ 5 to 15.

Sale *16
Reg. $20. Body Lingo'“ all 
cotton denim )ean Juniors'3-15

Sale 11.20
Reg. $14. Poly cotton print 
shirt For juniors'5 to 15.

Sale 10.40
Reg. 12.99. Western jeans in 
cotton denim Juniors' 5 to 15 
Sale pricei etiacllve 
through Saturday

for Boys

30%  « 50%
Spucial group boys shirts and ¡oans. 
At low prices. Does Not include 

entire stock

For Girls

30% '”50%*«
Special Group girls Fall Dresses, 
tops, pants. Reduced just in time 
for those fall days ahead.
Does Not Include intire Stock.

y/S4- JCPenney
Gsco, Texas
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THIS HAS BEEN a good 

summer in Cisco, observed 
Mr. Ed Bradshaw when we 
ran into him Monday. There 
have  been very  few 
lOOKlegree days as com­
pared to SO or so last sum­
mer. And temperatures have 
been in the upper 80s and 
lower 90s quite a lot.

As a general rule, if rain­
fall is fairly normal the fall 
season  begins to be 
noticeable after Sept 1st.

The Chester Norvells of 
Cisco enjoyed a cool summer 
in the Grand Junction, Col­
orado country. They drove 
up there last June in their 
motorhome and returned 
home recently Chester en­
joyed tro u t fish ing . 
Daughter Sondra and family 
drove out for a vacation with 
the Norvells

Chester says they started 
home two or three tunes and 
turned around and went 
back to Grand Junction after 
encountering weather they 
considered too hot

WE DROVE IN from El 
Paso with our travel trailer 
ng Sunday-500 miles in one 
day This was something of a 
record for us as we usually 
drive no more than about 300 
miles in a day

We left with our car air 
conditioner out and got home 
with it out The problem is 
the evaporator, a radiator- 
like thing under the glove 
compartment area of the 
front seat Before leaving 
town, we went to a local 
garage and the trouble was 
d e te rm in ed  But they 
couldn’t find a replacement 
evaporator, so we decided to 
go ahead as planned and to 
look for one along the way

We found an evaporator at 
an auto wrecking yard and 
watched the man take it off a 
car that was the same size 
and model as ours, so we felt 
lucky and began looking for 
somebody to change it. We 
soon d iscovered  th a t 
autom otive shops were 
reluctant to work under the 
glove compartment

Funeral Services 
For Mark Riggs 
Held Tuesday

F u n e ra l se rv ic e s  for 
Stephen Mark Riggs, 19, of 
Cisco, were at 2:30 p.m 
Tuesday at Kimbrough 
F'uneral Home Chapel T^e 
Rev Buddy Sipe of F'lrst 
Baptist Church officiated, 
assisted by the Rev Joe 
Philpott of Mitchell Baptist 
Church Burial was in 
Oak wood Cemetery.

Mr Riggs died early Sun­
day in a d.'-illing rig accident 
south of C sco.

He was bom P'ebruary 27, 
1962, in Gorman He had liv­
ed in Cisco for 16 years and 
was employed by Eastland 
Drilling Company

Survivors include his 
parents. Mr and .Mrs R N 
Riggs Sr of Cisco; two 
brothers, Ronald of Olden 
and Richard of Cisco; three 
sisters, Sandra Crutchfield 
and Ruth Riggs, both of 
Cisco, and Susan Allgood of 
Dallas; and his grand­
mother, Mrs Mary Belle 
Pack of Stephenville

Pallbearers were Kenny 
Miller, Johnny Moon, Jerry 
Taylor, Ken Sharp, Kevin 
S tr ick lan d  and F e rn ie  
Jaramillo

Graveside Services 
For Henry Bell
Held Tuesdoy

Graveside services for 
Henry Bell, 38, of May, were 
at 2 p.m. Tuesday in May 
Cemetery, directed by Hig­
ginbotham Funeral Home of 
Rising Star The Rev. Bill 
Campbell of First Baptist 
Church of May officiated

Mr. Bell died Sunday mor­
ning in the Veterans Ad­
m inistration Hospital in 
Temple after a long illness.

He was bom March 16, 
1943, in the Holder Com­
munity. He married Cam 
Thomas on January IS, 1971, 
in Lampasas

Survivors include his wife; 
two sons, Michael and Ed­
ward, both of the home; a 
daughter, Jo Beth of the 
home; a brother, Lonnie of 
May; two sisters, Marie 
Shaiffer of Cisco and Ramona 
Brown of WoodviUe, Mias.; 
and his parents Raymond 
and Paulifw Bell of May.

We made a date with a 
firm in Albuquerque and 
when we took the car there 
next morning, the man 
began making excuses. He 
smoked cigarettes and his 
fingers were yellow with 
nicotine. His wüfe was look­
ing after the office and the 
telephone, and he talked to 
her in a very disrespectful 
voice to her. And after a 
brief visit with him, we 
elected to look elsewhere for 
help.

At El Paso, we telephoned 
and made an appointment 
for 8 a m. the next morning 
When we drove 20 miles to 
the garage, the man took one 
look and announced I 
wouldn’t work under the 
dash of anybody’s car ”

At another garage, the 
man said they’d change out 
the evaporator and he and a 
Spanish talking man got on 
the job An hour or two later, 
they called to say the 
evaporator we’d bought and 
had been carrying around 
was the wrong size The car 
dealer there didn’t have a 
new one. We went to a big 
wrecking yard and the only- 
two cars like ours they had 
were inspected. One had 
been in a fire and the 
evaporator was ruined, and 
the evaporator had been 
removed from the other

So. It being Saturday and 
.Monday being a holiday, 
there wasn’t anything to do 
except wait We decided to 
drive back home while we 
were waiting

It wasn’t really too bad ex­
cept in the afternoons Driv­
ing at night or during the 
mornings was pretty com­
fortable. It IS the concensus 
of our family, however, that 
auto air conditioning is here 
to stay

OUR sœurs report that 
the new dove hunting season 
IS off to a good start with 
birds reasonably plentiful 

The Bill Huffmans were up 
from Houston for a visit with 
his mother and for his an­
nual hunting trip, which was 
successful Rainfall has 
been sufficient to provide 
plenty of food for birds 

The quail crop, which 
won’t be hunted until Dec. 1, 
promises to be super, we’re 
told. Game wardens are 
pretty rough on folks who 
shoot quails out of season. 
There are many tiny quails 
following the adults right 
now and to shoot the adults 
would result in loss of the 
covey

MR. AND MKS. HERSHEL TOMLINSON

Mr. and M rs. Tomlinson To 
Be Honored On 50th 
Wedding Anniversary Sat.

Mr and Mrs. Hershel 
Tomlinson will be honored 
on their SOth wedding an­
niversary with a reception

your 
marketplacel
mm

buy your tickets -  $2.50 for 
adults and 11.50 for students, 
a savings over what you’ll 
pay at the gate. All proceeds 
go to charitable projects of 
area Lions Clubs.

This year’s game is the 4th 
and about $20,000 has been 
raised as a result of the bowl 
games, and the money has 
benefitted the Texas Lions 
Camp for Crippled, Blind 
and Diabetic Children, the 
District Lions Eye Bank pro­
gram, the Ijons-Care pro­
gram, the Lions Interna­
tional Foundation and local 
Ijons projects.

l.et’s all get our tickets 
and get ready.

from 3 to 5 p.m. Saturday, 
September 12, at the Cisco 
Country Club.

The reception will be 
hosted by their children.

R.L. Wyatts 
Move To Qsco

R.L. Wyatt and his wife. 
Ruby, have moved to Cisco 
from Spearman. He was the 
shop foreman for Excel 
Chevrolet Company for over 
15 years. He bought his 
mother’s home, 1001 West 
7th Street. He is the brother 
of Ixu Dial and Frances 
Frailey.

Mr. Wyatt will be shop 
foreman at Baird for Hanner 
Chevrolet Co. They are 
Southern Baptist.

T hursday,
September 10, 1V81

WORD of GOD

For ThoM  Who Mourn;
Let not your heart be 

troubled: ye believe In 
God, believr* also In me

THE LIONS BOWL foot­
ball game, which is slated 
Sept 26th at Breckenridge 
between Cisco and Ranger 
colleges, IS becoming quite 
an event And you’ll want to 
check with a Iwal Lion to

HOME FROM A travel 
trailer vacation trip to Utah,
Wyoming and Colorado are 
the Willis Parkers. They 
report a delightful trip . . .  A 
guest in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs Sutton Crofts is her 
sister, Mrs. Dorothy Crofts, 
of Tucson, Arizona. labor 
Day weekend visitors in the 
Crofts home were their 
daughters, Carolyn Webster 
of Fort Worth and Dot Mittel 
and family of Arlington.

John ¡4:1-4
*'*‘* * * * * '“* * ‘~‘~'‘~*‘~'‘“ *‘~‘“ “‘ Tm ri7nnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnnoooui

III my Father's house 
are many mansions: If 
it were not so, I would 
have told you I go to 
prepare a place for you.

And if I 00 and prepare 
a place for you I will 
come again, and receive 
you unto myself, that 
where I am, there ye 
may be also.

And
know,
know.

whither I go 
and the way

ye
ye

Mobile Shrimp Market Will Be at Doug's 
Mobil Stotion, 718 Avenue D One Day 
Only, Saturday, September 12, 9 to 6.

5 Lb. Box Small Boiling Shrimp *19”
5 Lb. Box Large Boiling Shrimp 2̂5“

3 Lb. Box Large Breaded Shrimp *12”
3 Lb. Box Jumbo Breaded Shrimp M6”

<nhg Crab Legs M** Per Lb.
J/PS Legs *3*" Per Lb.

Plus Other Assorted Seafood Products,f / j

We*re Open!
TV Sales & Service

26 yrs experience

Zenith •Philco  
Sylvania# Admiral 
Sharp#Air Temp
Also Major Appliances

Sight ‘N’ Sound
(formerly Rockwell Lumber) 

107 E. 5th Cisco 
442-4131

Hours: 9-5
Closed Saturday & Sunday

Eostlond Church 
To Show Him

Out of the incredible hor­
ror of Idi Amin's Uganda 
comes "Some Through the 
Fire” , a classic film to be 
shown free to the public at 
7:30 p.m. Sunday. Sept. 13, at 
F ir s t  B ap tis t C hurch, 
Eastland

The public is cordially in­
vited, said Pastor Rev. Jim 
Hooten, who with his wife 
Peggy, were missionaries in 
Uganda for some 18 years, 
and know from first hand 
some of the horror of Amin’s 
dictatorship.

The Christians of Uganda 
went through eight years of 
incredible horror.

Amazingly, they also ex­
perienced eight years made 
beautiful by the manifesta­
tion of God’.'^^ace in their 
lives.

One out of every twenty- 
four Ugandans perished. 
Many died following in­
describable torture.

Yet the church remained 
victorious, growing in spite 
of flagrant censure and 
sadistic persecution. Conse­
quently, the motion picture, 
SOME THROUGH THE 
F'IRE, not only documents 
what happened in Uganda 
but sounds a clear message 
for Christians everywhere to 
take the measure of their 
own committment, their own 
readiness for testing.

"What Ugandans learned 
yesterday," the film’s nar­
rator says, "you may need to 
know tomorrow."

s t u d io ;
Q uolity-Snapshots 

1 C am eras & Supplies 
Films-AII Sizes 
And Of Course 

Fine Photography 
Is Our Business

lotton's 
, Studio
{♦42-2565 300 W. Ollii

I'he producers exercises 
care, however, to avoid 
mere sensationalism.

The film concludes with a

visit to one of the revival 
fellowhsip groups, remnant 
of the great East Africa 
Revival, and very possibly a

format for what is yet to 
come in the hearts and lives 
of our African brothers and 
sisters.

CJC Wrangler Football Action

I

Marvallee’s Dress Shop
W e  (J iv t* 

(ireen Stamps
Open Mon.-Sat. 611 East Hth

9 to 5:30 ( ’¡SCO

New Shipment of Jeans
Many New F'all Tops cK: Dresses

2 0 %  and more off regular  price

Still Some Summer Tops '‘2 ’*'̂  a n d  u p
___________ g o od a s s o r t  m e n  I

Several Styles of 
Nurse Uniform Pants Suits

to ^22^^
s i z e s  1 -21 ' 2

Separate Tops .■.„ri’’l l  
Uniform Pants

»5

:95Uniform Dress M P' and M5’ 
Maternity Wear 2 0 %  of f  r e g u l a r  p r i c e  

New Born iiift Hems

Ï

FREE 24 OZ. COKF WHEN YOU 
BUY

2 CORN S119 
DOGSc I

Shurfine R tg . >7" >1" O ff

Vegetable Oil SJ29

Shurfine 16 o i. can

Applesauce

Shurfine 1 lb. box
Saltine Crackers
ALL PURPOSE

CLADIOLA 
FLOUR

7 5

5 LB. 
BAG

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
SEPTEMBER 10-12.1981 

WHILE SUPPLIES LAST

ALLSUP'S
CONVENIENCE STORES

THERE'S OHE HEAR YOU”


