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Four Firms Robbed
Robberies of four business 

firms have been reported this 
week. Stratford Butane Co. 
and Golden Spread Implement 
Co. business houses wre entered 
Friday night. City Drug and 
Yates Drug were robbed Mon­
day night.

Friday night an estimated 
$35.00 to $40.00 in cash was tak­
en from the Stratford Butane 
Co. Entrance to the building 
was gained by prying open a 
back door.

Papers in the office of the 
Golden Spread Implement Co. 
were scattered as the intruder 
searched for money. Between 
$1.00 and $1.25 in pennies were 
taken from the cash register. 
Entrance to the building was 
gained by breaking in through a 
rear window of the building.

City Drug lost an estimated 
$600.00 in c a s h ,
c h e c k s ,  damage and 
merchandise Monday night 
when thieves enter the building 
by cutting a hole in the roof. 
Mrs. L. E. Bonar, who was in 
charge of the pharmacy, thought 
at first that no narcotics were 
taken. When M. S. Horton ar­
rived, he checked a report a- 
gainst his stock of morphine and 
found that 76 quarter grain 
morphine tablets had been tak­
en. Checks and records were 
left scattered over the floor of 
the rear of the building and 
some had been left on the roof 
of the building where many were 
left. A cash drawer contain­
ing silver was also left on the 
roof. Little if any of ts con­
tents were taken.

An undetermined amount of 
merchandise, some silver in the 
change drawer and the receipts 
of Robbie’s Gift Shoppe were 
taken from the Yates Drug safe. 
The safe, maintained for a 
protection of records from fire 
and could have been easily op­
ened, was damaged. The knob 
of the safe was knocked off, and 
the safe opened the hard way. 
A 24-inch screw driver, pos­
sibly used to pry off ceiling 
boards, was also used to pry 
the lock from the rear door of 
the drug store, and left laying 
on the floor. When the in­
truder dropped through the 
ceiling he knocked off part of 
the merchandise from a dis­
play counter. Part of the mer­
chandise was tossed back on the 
showcase in a hap-hazard man­
ner. F. L. Yates said he was 
almost certain that a new razor 
and some cigarettes had been 
taken, but his collection of old 
silver dollars were left untouch­
ed. The thief boldly left the 
Yates Drug building, walking out 
under a flood light left burning 
above the door.

Officers from nearby towns 
aided local law enforcement of­
ficers in a search for finger­
prints. Good records of the 
men’s footprints were secured 
from the roof of The First State 
Bank building. Two men had 
walked back and forth across 
the freshly tarred roof, leaving 
well implanted foot prints. One 
wore boots and the other wore 
ripple sole shoes.

Officers believe that at least 
two men and possibly a third 
were involed in the two robber­
ies Monday night.

C. B. Dodson 
In Amarillo 
Hospital

C. B. (Red) Dodson was taken 
to an Amarillo specialist Mon­
day and is in Room 750 at North­
west Texas Hospital.

Over two-weeks ago, Mr. Dod­
son was stricken with a heart 
attack at his home and was tak­
en to Coon Memorial Hospital 
where he was a patient until 
going to Amarillo.

According to friends, his heart 
condition is aggravated by 
asthma.

“ COW POKES” by ACE REID

“ If National Farm Safety Week doesn’t git here soon there ain’t gonna 
be none of us left to celebrate it!”

Cub Scout 50th Anniversary 
Party In Park Saturday Evening

Stratford Cub Scouts will hold 
their 50th anniversary jubilee 
party in the City Park at 7:30 
p. m. Saturday. Each Cub 
Scout will take a sack lunch. 
Games and entertainment for 
their enjoyment will be provided.

Cub Scouts participating in 
the activities will have the only 
opportunity in their life time to 
earn a 50th anniversary patch 
to wear on his sleeve. Cub 
Scouts will pay 254 for the 
patches.

Parents of the 30 cub scouts 
expected to take part in the 
golden jubilee cub scout 50th 
anniversary party, are invited to 
be guests of the boys.

Cubmaster C. C. Plunk will be 
assisted by Assistant Cubmaster 
Owen Hudson in making ar  ̂
rangements for the entertain­
ment for the evening.

Polio Cases 
Declining 
In Texas

At the end of June — July 2, 
there were only 19 cases of par­
alytic polio in Texas compared 
to 92 cases during the same 
period last year, State Helath 
Department figures show.

Only two cases were registered 
in the week ending July 2. The 
five year median for the cor­
responding week has been 19 
cases of paralytic polio.

Nonparalytic polio also shows 
a significant drop with a total 
of 14 cases compared to 39 
cases last year at this time.

Despite the encouraging fig­
ures, polio continues to strike 
hard and too often, most often 
at children below four years of 
age.

The series of three Salk anti­
polio shots has proven over­
whelmingly successful. Par­
ents are iirged to have their 
children of preschool age polio 

(Continued on Page 6)

Church Music 
Workshop 
July 25-29

Bill Pendleton 
Sustains Eye 
Injury

sus-W. L. (Bill) Pendleton 
tained a painful injury to one 
eye while playing badminton 
Friday evening with his three 
sons, Bobby, Tommy and Lee. 
One of the birds struck Pendle­
ton in the eye. resulting in inter­
nal bleeding.

He was hospitalized in St. An­
thony Hospital in Amarillo, un­
der the care of a specialist.

Age group having the greatest 
number of fatalities from acci­
dents on farmland and around 
farm buildings is 5-14 years.

ABILENE — Three Methodist 
annual conferences and McMur- 
ry College are sponsoring a new 
workshop in the church music 
field, July 25-29.

Not planned from the techni­
cal standpoint, the workshop is 
open to choir directors, choir 
singers, organists, ministers and 
music students.

The workshop, a new venture 
on the McMurry campus, is in­
tended to give the members op­
portunities in the areas of choir 
development in all age groups, 
singing techniques, service play­
ing, church music administra­
tion, pastor-music staff rela­
tions and a worship-centered 
church music program.

Serving on the staff of the|ii,000 farm residents die each

Jack Smith 
On Duty With 
Pacific Fleet

PEARL HARBOR — Jack P. 
Smith, fire control technician 
first class, USN, son of Earl 
Smith and husband of the for­
mer Miss Betty J. Sims of 
Stratford, departed Pearl Har­
bour June 26 aboard the snorkel 
submarine USS Segundo for a 
six-month tour of duty with the 
U. S. Pacific Fleet in the Wes­
tern Pacific.

The Segundo is named after 
a rare fish of the Cavalla fam­
ily.

Accidents to farm residents 
claim more than 11,300 victims 
and injure about 950,000 per­
sons annually, according to the 
National Safety Council.

Set $1.78 ’61 
Wheat Price
J. R. Leal 
Enlists In 
Air Force

Joe Ray Leal, 18 year old son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Steve Leal, has 
enlisted in the U. S. Air Force 
and has been stationed at Lack- 
land Air Force Base in San An­
tonia. Leal was a junior in 
Stratford High School. He en­
tered training in the Air Force 
Monday.

22 Boy Scouts Will Attend 
Summer Camp At Camp Kiowa

Twenty-two Boy Scouts will 
leave Sunday to attend sum­
mer camp at Camp Kiowa near 
Canadian.

Scouts planning to attend in­
clude: Scott Whorton, E. H. 
Baker, Larry Bates, Danny 
Brannan, Steve Dettle, Lynn 
Gaylord, Billy Green, Jimmy 
Gupton, Lanny Harris, Walter 
Lasley, Orland Lasley, Don 
Parvin, Lynn Reynolds, Teddy 
Reynolds, Buddy Riggs, Ted 
Martin, Jack Standefer, Lynn 
Stephenson, Allan Wells, Wes­
ley Willey, and Donny Woolsey.

Scoutmaster Jim Close will 
accompany the boys. Sixty 
boys will be at the camp, one- 
third of them from Stratford. 
Joe Willey, Emory Roper and R. 
W. Standefer Jr. plan to be at 
the camp part of the time to as­
sist Jim Close in supervising the' 
activities.

The camp opens Sunday and 
will continue through Satur­
day.

The boy scouts will meet at the 
City Hall at 1:00 p. m. and the 
school bus taking them to camp 
will leave for Camp Kiowa at 
1:30 p. m.

Training at Camp Kiowa con­
sists of swimming, life saving,’ 
rowing and canoeing. Boys may 
earn four merit badges by at­
tending the camp.

Llano Estacado and Adobe 
Walls Councils will provide ade­
quate leadership for the boys at­
tending the camp.

Curbing Farm Accident Problem 
Is Goal Of ‘Farm Safety Week’

Farm accidents claim about 
3,500 lives each year, more than 
any other industry. Some

one-week school wiU be Lynn 
Thayer, the minister of music 
at Asbury Methodist Church, El 
Paso in the New Mexico confer­
ence.

The minister of music from 
the University Park Methodist 
Church in Dallas, Central Tex­
as Conference, Robert E. Scog- 
gin will also be on the staff. He 
is the Texas State Chairman of 
the American Guild of Organ­
ists and is an organ recitalist.

The Rev. Jordan Grooms, min­
ister of the Polk Street Metho­
dist CJhurch, Amarillo, North­
west Texas Conference, will be 
the keynote speaker for the 
week. His topic is “Music and 
Worship in the Church.”

Dr. Richard C. von Ende, head 
of the McMurry Fine Arts De­
partment, is director of the 
workshop. Other McMurry 
faculty members will be on the 
staff.

Arrangements for the work­
shop have been made through 
the executive secretaries of the 
boards of education of the con­
ference. . ; , . i ‘

year in all types of accidents, 
and another million suffer ac­
cidental injuries.

To direct attention to this ap­
palling problem. President 
Eisenhower has designated the 
week of July 24-30 as “Nation­
al Farm Safety Week.” In 
Texas, Governor Daniel has 
proclaimed the period “Farm 
Safety Week in Texas.” The 
Texas Farm and Ranch Safety 
Ctouncil, together with the Texas 
Safety Association, Texas Agri­
cultural Extension Service and 
the Texas Farm Bureau, is 
pushing a farm safety education 
program during the week.

Theme of the observance is 
“Enjoy Farm — Practice Safe­
ty.” Objective of the educa­
tional effort is to curb the soar­
ing farm accident problem 
which hits one farm family in 
four each year.

Texas is among the top ten 
states in the nation in accident 
rates associated with drownings, 
firearms, bums and electricity. 
The major cause of accidents a- 
cross the nation is machinery,

which accounts for about 35 per 
cent of all accidents, followed 
by drownings, firearms, falls, 
blows, animals, burns, electri­
city and lightning.

In his proclamation desig­
nating National Farm Safety 
Week, the President noted that 
accidents “substantially reduce 
the productive capacity of our 
farming industry.” Governor 
Daniel’s proclamation urged 
farm families to “ increase their 
vigilance against needless acci­
dents.” The Governor said the 
nation’s economy is dependent 
upon the continued well-being 
and progress of its agricultural 
population, and accidents from 
farm work cause needless suf- 
ferring, distress and loss of life 
each year among rural families.

The rate of accidental deaths 
from work and recreational ac­
tivities on farms is increasing 
slightly each year. The death 
rates associated with machin­
ery, drownings, firearms and 
electrical current are increas­
ing, while those associated with 
animals, falls, lightning and 
bums are showing some de- 

(Oontinued on Page 6)

Pioneers 
Return To 
Spurlock

(By Mrs. L. M. Fedric)
On Sunday, July 17, at an all 

day homecoming, the Spurlock 
Community Chapel was the 
scene of a happy and glorious 
occasion, when pioneers of the 
Spurlock Community and of the 
Spurlock Church met with fam­
ilies, friends and relatives who 
have lived in the community and 
attended church there at some 
time during the almost sixty 
years of the Church’s existence. 
Approximately 175 to 185 people 
attended. Some left without 
signing the guest book.

Sunday School was conducted 
at 10:00 a. m. by superintendent 
Neal Spurlock with 86 present. 
Mrs. E. W. Carter was teacher 
of the adult class.

Rev. D. D. Creecy, pastor, de­
livered the 11:00 o’clock sermon 
to a well filled house. His 
text: “What is man, that thou 
art mindful of him? Psalm 
8:4a.

Miss Kay Spurlock sang a spe­
cial number entitled “He.”

Lunch was spread at 12:00 
o ’clock on tables, picnic style, in 
the fellowship hall in the base­
ment of the church.

There was a visiting period of 
two hours when old friends had 
time to catch up on the past. 
Everyone gathered in the sanc­
tuary at 2:30 p. m. for an af­
ternoon program.

Singing by the congregation 
headed the program with Mrs. 
Arrell Cummings of Childress at 
the piano and Mrs. Marion Fore­
man of Plainview as song leader. 
They selected “Songs we used to 
sing” when they were pianist 
and song leader at Spurlock 25 
years ago.

Miss Jean Spurlock of Amarillo 
read the Spurlock Church His­
tory.

Mr. C. F. Moon of Amarillo 
lead in prayer. Mr. Moon ser­
ved as Sunday School superin­
tendent at Sipurlock thirty years 
ago.

Miss Kay Spurlock sang 
“Somebody Bigger Than You 
And I.”

Mr. Lawrence Ashby of Dal- 
hart gave a talk. Mr. Ashby was 
the school teacher at Spurlock 
fifty years ago. Mr. Ashby and 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Mullins 
were recognized as the oldest 
settlers there and were given a 
hand in tribute. Mrs. Arthur 
Mullins was the only charter 
member of the Spurlock Church 
present.

David Flyr, an accomplished 
musician, son of the late L. A. 
Flyr and Mrs. Bonnie Flyr, play- 

(Continued on Page 5)

The U. S. Department of 
Agriculture, in line with cur­
rently controlling legislation, 
announces an “advance” min­
imum national average support 
price of $1.78 per bushel for 
1961-crop wheat, if wheat mar­
keting quotas are approved by 
producers in the July 21 refer­
endum.

The advance support price re­
flects 75 per cent of the esti­
mated parity price for wheat as 
of the beginning of the 1961-62 
marketing year July 1, 1961.
This percent-of-parity level of 
support is indicated on the ba­
sis of estimated wheat supplies 
available for the marketing year.

Unless growers disapprove 
quotas, the law provides for a 
variable support (between 75 
and 90 per cent of parity) based 
on the relationship between the 
estimated supply of wheat avail­
able for the marketing year and 
a determined normal supply for 
the year. The “forward pric­
ing” provisions authorize set­
ting a minimum wheat support 
price in advance of planting 
time, using the latest informa­
tion and statistics available.

The estimated total supply of 
wheat for the 1961-62 market­
ing year which begins on July 
1, 1961, is 196.1 per cent of the 
normal supply. With quotas 
in effect, this calls for a mini­
mum 75 per cent level of sup­
port under the law’s supply for­
mula.

If marketing quotas are ap­
proved by producers, the na­
tional average support price in 
the commercial area will not 
be less, than the 31.78 per bush­
el announced July 5. This 
minimum everage support will 
not be reduced but may be in­
creased if the combination of 
the wheat parity price as of 
July 1, 1961, and wheat supply 
relationships of that date in­
dicate a higher price.

Producers in 39 commercial 
States who stay within their 
acreage allotments will be eli­
gible for pfflce support. In 
the 11 noncommercial States, 
county support rates, as provid­
ed by law when allotments are 
in effect in the commercial 
States, will be 75 per cent of 
what they would be if the com­
mercial counties were in the 
commercial area.

If marketing quotas are dis­
approved in the July referen­
dum, the support level in the 
commercial wheat-producing 
States under legislation pro­
visions will be 50 per cent of 
parity, or a national average o f 
about $1.18 per bushel on the 
basis of the estimated parity 
price for July 1, 1961. Compli­
ance with acreage allotments 
would continue to be a condition 
of eligibility for the lower sup­
port price. Under these cir­
cumstances, noncommercial 
support rates would be at 75 
per cent of this lower figure. 
Wheat Supply Situation

In determining the advance 
minimum support level for 1961 
crop wheat on the basis of sup­
ply relationships, the normal 
supply of Wheat for the 1961-62 
marketing year was estimated 
to be 1,349,000,000 bushels and 
the total supply 2,645,000,000 
bushels. The total supply is 
196.1 per cent of the normal 
supply and a percentage above 
130 per cent calls for support at 
a 75-per cent of parity level.

Sorority Dance 
Saturday Night

The Nu Beta chapter of Beta 
Sigma Phi will sponsor a sum­
mer dance Saturday night In 
the American Legion Hall at 
9:00 o’clock. Music will be fur­
nished by Bob G. Smith’s or­
chestra. The hall will be de­
corated in a Hawaiian theme. 
Tickets are $3.00 per couple.
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Town Talk
Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Monroe 

and daughters of Amarillo, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Elbert Williams 
-of Liberal, Kansas were guests 
in  the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Owen Palmer Sunday.

Tamy, Teri and Jami Heydrick 
o f  Wichita Falls are visiting in 
the home of their grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. P. M. Keener.

Mrs. Fred McDaniel and son, 
Mike, returned Monday from 
Junction City, Kansas, where 
they had been visiting since 
July 7, with Mrs. McDaniel’s par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Myron Leedy, 
-and her daughter, Patti McDan­
iel, who has been visiting her 
grandparents several weeks. 
Thursday of last week, Mike 
celebrated his sixth birthday 
with a cookout, attended by rela­
tives and friends. On Friday 
the Leedys and Mrs. McDaniel 
and children went to Kansas 
City and attended the ball game 
between the Boston Red Socks 
and the Kansas City Athletics. 
Saturday night, they enjoyed 
seeing “Annie Get Your Gun,” 
starring Gordon and Sheila Mc­

Rae and their four children at 
the Starlite Theatre in Swope 
Park. While in Kansas City, 
they were guests in the home of 
Mrs. McDaniel’s aunt, Mrs. Irene 
Higley, who was a visitor in the 
McDaniel home recently.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Walsh vis­
ited their sons-in-law and 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Summers and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Palko, in Amarillo over last week 
end.

Mr. and Mrs. T. D. Chisum vis­
ited Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Wilson 
in Dumas Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ed Selders of 
Lamar, Colorado and Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Murdock of Dal- 
hart were visitors in the Lyall 
Murdock home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. H. M. Flores and 
Barbara, returned home Wed­
nesday of last week from Wood­
land Park, Colorado. Barbara 
had been attending Camp Wa- 
Na-Ka for the past four weeks.

Protect and Beautify
YOUR HOME WITH

A L L I E D  P A I N T
No job is too big or too small. We have Allied Paints for 

all types of services.

New Artistic FIGURINES
PIONEER-WEAR APPAREL 
STRAW HATS for Children

Nina’s Souvenir
PHONE 2531

G E T  Y O U R

Motor Tune-Up
For Vacation Driving

We Use These 10 Commandments for Good Performance 
And Economy of Operation:

Check Engine Compression.
Clean and adjust spark plugs.
Test battery and clean terminals. 
Check distributor points and timing. 
Test coil and condenser.
Free up manifold heat control. 
Tighten cylinder head and manifold 

bolts.
Set carburetor idle adjustments. 
Inspect hose connections and tighten 

fan belt.
Check vacuum advance.

T. 0 . C. Motor Co.
Studebaker Cars and Trucks

Killing
W I T H

Pleasure
Bindweed Our Specialty

T E X A S
WEED & GRASS CONTROL, Inc.

P. O. BOX 477 ODEM, TEXAS

Insured and Bonded, Okla. & Texas
IF IT HELPS? WE TAKE ASSIGNMENTS

4 Inspected Calibrated Rigs
Amchem Proven Benzac-Acids 

Do A Better Job For Less
OFFICES

Stratford ............................  Phone 5051
GUYMON .............................................................  PHONE 130
BOISE CITY ........................ PHONE 6011
HOOKER ...............  PHONE OL 2-2403
HEREFORD .......... PHONE E.M. 4-0979
CORPUS CHRISTI ................................  PHONE T.E. 5-9842

EARLY START . . . Baby buggy 
bandwagon belongs to Katrina 
Vanden Heuvel, 7 - months - old, 
who boosts her dad for Congress 
on her daily outings in New 
York’s Central Park.

Mr. and Mrs. Flores had gone 
there on Sunday to attend the 
camps closing activities during 
the first of the week.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Brannan 
and daughter, Kay, of Lubbock 
returned home Thursday of last 
week after spending a few days 
visiting in the home of his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Lewie Bran- 
nan.

Mr. and Mrs. Arrel Cummings 
of Childress, and son and daugh­
ter-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. George 
Edward Cummings, and three 
sons of Oklahoma City visited 
relatives in the home of Mrs. 
J. G. Cummings Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. T. L. Taylor and 
Bobby, who have been visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Johnson and 
baby son, Taylor, in Lubbock, 
returned home Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Van B. Boston, 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Judd and 
Mr. and Mrs. P. L. Yates attend­
ed the gift show in Amarillo 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. J. Goule of Vis­
alia, California came Thursday 
of last week and remained un­
til Sunday for a visit in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Sid Board. 
Friday evening Mrs. Board en­
tertained with a fish fry. Oth­
er guests were Mrs. Lily Judd, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Judd and 
Cheryl.

Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Wheatley 
from Earth visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Huff last week. Mrs. Wheat- 
ley is Mr. Huff’s niece.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard L. Hart 
and children of Los Ctescenta, 
California are guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. E. R. 
McNeal.

Mrs. Edd C. Garoutte, Mrs. 
Joe Sullivan, Mrs. Theo Woods 
of Guymon, Mrs. Fritz Steinber- 
ger and Judy are spending a 
few days visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
J. B. Rider and other relatives 
in Canon City, Colorado.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Huff had as 
week end guests, Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Farrow of Amarillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Lyall Murdock 
left Monday afternoon to at­
tended the funeral of a sister- 
in-law in Nyssa, Oregon.

Mr. and Mrs. Clinton Ragsdale 
and sons, Jim and Pat, of Pritch, 
were guests recently in the home 
of Mrs. Ragsdale’s grandmoth­
er, Mrs. J. G. Cummings.

Mr. and Mrs. R. E. Kessie of 
Amarillo were week end guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. J. R. Pendleton 
and other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Kirk­
wood and baby, Lesa Caye, of 
Canyon visited over the week 
end in the home of his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Kirkwood and 
sons.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Wilson 
and daughters, Teri and Sharon, 
left the first of the week for 
Chicago, Illinois for a visit with 
Mrs. Wilson’s brother-in-law 
and sister, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Miller.

Mr. and Mrs. M. L. Mitts have 
returned home from a vacation 
in California.

Mr. and Mrs. V. W. Foreman 
and daughter, Dallas, were week 
end guests in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Ross Roy in Borger.

Mr. and Mrs. M. H. Harrison 
visited in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Felix iFlanagan in Tex-

homa Sunday.

Rhonda Houston has returned 
home from summer camp.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Woolsey, 
Pam and David, and Earl Wool­
sey of Canon City, Colorado 
were week end guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Woolsey. Earl and David Wool­
sey remained for a week’s visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Newton Crab­
tree and son, Charlie, and Er­

nest Newton Ellison visited in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Mar­
shall Crabtree and children in 
Eads, Colorado Sunday.

Mrs. Hazel Martin visited in 
the home of Mrs. B. R. Crabtree 
in Dalhart Thursday afternoon 
of last week.

Mrs. Tim Flores went to Ama­
rillo Wednesday of last week for 
a visit with her son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. George 
Cannon and Anne Rochelle, and

Mr. and Mrs. Max Johnson and 
baby. Mrs. Johnson is her 
granddaughter. Mrs. Flores 
and Mrs. Cannon went to Tulia 
Sunday, where they visited Mrs. 
Flores’ b r o t h e r - i n -  
law and his wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
S. F. Flores and another relative, 
Carl Young, and Mrs. Dave 
Wheeler and two sisters. Mrs. 
Flores returned home Wednes­
day.

Mrs. Chester Hall of Brook- 
ville, Kansas is here visiting her

parents, Mr. and Mrs. W. P. 
Mullican and other relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Luther Blades 
and Orville Lee visited from 
Tuesday to Friday of last week 
with Mrs. Blades parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. R. T. Moore, in Ralls.

Ethel Preston is visiting with 
relatives in California.

Charles Floyd made a busi­
ness trip to South Bend, Indiana 
this week.

WAGON LOAD OF DEALS

The Lark 2-door wagon is big news at your independent Studebaker 
dealer’s—at big dealin’ prices. Big head-room, hip-room, shoulder-room, 
leg-room, kiddie-room . . .  67 feet of cargo space—that’s-a-plentyl Every­
thing’s big about The Lark 2-door wagon—only the price tag is little.

T. O. C. MOTOR CO.
" M R K

BYSTUDEBAKERStratford, Texas

" l U  IA2Z M F S " — v n iiis  m O N L Y  ’ F
Your Studebaker Dealer is the man to see for an A BC — "Always Buy Certified Used Car.

Lltten to the "WORLD JAZI SERIES"over 
iCBS RADIO Network all euinmer long. SeeyourStudebaker Dealer to get

J U L Y

Shoe Clearance
D E B  S H O E S TRIM TRED HERS

WHITE and BEIGE HEELS WHITE or BEIGE
$ 7 . 9 9

PAIR 1 6 - 9 9
PAIR

WOMEN’S

C A S U A L  S H O E S MISSES

DEB and TRIM TRED SANDALS and P U T S
$ 5 . 9 9

PAIR
$ 2 - 9 9

PAIR

GIRLS WOMENS
W H I T E  S T R A P S SUMMER MILLINERY

Poll Parrot and Scamperos

$ 3 . 9 9
PAIR

$ 3.00
EACH

Summer Dresses 1 /2  price 
Stratford Department Store
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Town Talk
Mr. and Mrs. Gene French of 

Raton, New Mexico visited rela­
tives in Stratford and attend­
ed the Spurlock reunion Sun­
day.

Raymond Kirkwood of Can­
yon, plan to leave Sunday night 
for Quanico, Virginia for six 
weeks of Marine Corps Train­
ing.

Mr. and Mrs. Lex Board and 
son, Wayne, of Morse were re­
cent guests in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Sid Board.

J. N. Bridwell of Texhoma was 
a business visitor here Mon­
day.

Mrs. Bud Coats of Emory, Tex­
as returned home Sunday after 
a visit in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Alex Coats.

Among the Sick
Mrs. Jane Pool has been con­

fined to her bed the past week, 
but is reported to be improving, 
and able to be up part of the 
time.

Janet James, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Bob James of Felt, 
underwent an appendicitis oper­

ation in St. Joseph’s Hospital in 
Clayton, New Mexico Friday. 
Mrs. Royal Pendleton visited her 
granddaughter in Clayon Satur­
day.

Beauty Spot 
Of The Week

The flowers in the front yard 
at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Mullins and daughter, 
Mrs. Lois Holmes has been se­
lected as the ̂ beauty spot of the 
week by the Garden Club Com­
mittee.

Mrs. Jack Pugh was admitted 
as a patient to Northwest Texas 
Hospital in Amarillo the first of 
the week.

Ann Burgess underwent sur­
gery in Dumas Memorial Hos­
pital the middle of the week.

Mrs. Garland Bardwell is 
medical patient in Dumas Me­
morial Hospital in Dumas.

■ Madeline Reesing is confined 
to her bed at home this week as 
the result of a back injury re­
ceived when she was run ov^r 
by a car when she was a small 
child.

W. P. Mullican continues to be 
quite ill at his home.

A. E. Pronger is a medical pa 
tient in Dumas Memorial Hos­
pital.

A. E. Lowe, who has been ill 
for some time, was taken back 
to Dumas Memorial Hospital 
Monday for treatment.

Want Ads
Announcements

STRATFORD LODGE 874 
W. S. Frizzell Jr., W. M. 

Edward Brannan, Sec. 
STATED COMMUNICATION

Third Thursday Every Mouth 
8:00 P. M.

For Sale
Stone-Field custom tailored 

Suits, sport coats and slacks. 
Ideasured to fit. See Edward 
Brannan, Phone 3521. 46-tfc

You can’t get better Cari>et 
Deals any where than you can 
at McMahen Furniture Co. 5-tfc

Several good used Vacuum 
Cleaners at bargain prices at 
McMahen Furniture Co. 20-tfc

LEES all-new 501 Nylon Car­
pet, for free estimate call WE 
5-4811 Dumas, Collect. — Woody 
Furniture Co. 38-tfc

For the best buys in Furni­
ture and carpet, see Woody 
Furniture Co., Dumas, Texas, 
call WE 5-4811 collect for free 
estimate. 38-tfc

FOR SALE: Four residential 
lots on pavement in East Strat­
ford, and two corner residential 
lots. — Darrell Cotney, Phone 
3351. 18-tfc

FOR SALE: Stratford Maytag 
Laundry, business, building and 
lots, pavement on two sides. — 
John Haney, Phone 4456. 29-tfc

1955 CHEVROLET 4-door, 
will sell or trade for truck. Car 
has 4 barrel carburetor, dual 
exhaust and is a good clean car. 
— Robert Bolster, Phone 4726.

22-tfc
FOR SALE: Berkshire open 

ind bred gilts, and boars. — 
irthur Judd. 50-tfc

FOR SALE: Late model,
Singer automatic Zig Zag sew­
ing machine, to reliable party 
assuming our last 10 payments 
o f $9.64 each. Guarantee in 
effect. Write Credit Manager, 
Box 563, Enid, Okla. 30-2tc

FREIE Equity-Singer portable 
sewing machine, with button 
holer, may be bought on pay­
ments or will discount for cash. 
Balance due only $26.40. Write 
Credit Manager, Box 563, Enid, 
Okla. 30-2tc

REPOSSESSED: 1960 Zig Zag 
'console sewing machine. Life 
Time guarantee in effect, to 
party assuming last 12 pay­
ments, will discount for cash. 
Write Credit Manager, Box 563, 
Enid, Okla. 30-2tc

Wanted
WANTED: Ironing to do in my 

home. — Mrs. Ruby Huggins.
30-tfc

WANTED: Sewing to do in my 
home. Will also cover buckles, 
make button holes and belts. 
— Mrs. W. J. Lowe, Phone 4381.

13-tfc
WANTED: Emplpsonent as 

baby sitter, in your home or in 
ours. — June Huggins. 29-3tc

Houses For Sale
FOR SALE: Modern home 

with four rooms and a bath, on 
five lots; will sell all or part of 
the lots with the home. On 
street to be paved. — Leonard 
Plunk. 24-tfc

FOR SALE: Two Story 7-room 
house on four lots. House is in­
sulated and has new roof. — 
C. C. Plunk. 15-tfc

FOR SALE: Income Property, 
one bedroom furnished house 
and two bedroom unfurnished 
house. Both modern. See F. 
L. Yates. 11-tfc

FOR SALE: Four Bedroom 
modern home, on four corner 
lots, former Seaman house, 
shown by appointment only. — 
Backus Real Estate, Dalhart, 
Texas, Phone CH 9-2496. 29-tfc

Special Services
FOR THE BEST in house mov­

ing, call Chestnut 9-2084. — E. 
O. Matthews, Dalhart. 50-tfc

Mrs. Wohlford 
EiUtertains 
Embroidery Club

The Embroidery Club met 
Thursday, July 14, in the lovely 
home of Mrs. Sam Wohlford, 
and the usual sewing session and 
conversation were enjoyed.

Lovely refreshments were 
served to the following mem­
bers: Mesdames D. L. Buckles, 
E. W. Butler, Zelda Dunlap, 
Hattie Flores, F. A. Judd, Gro­
ver Keown, A. E. Pronger, Roy­
al Pendleton, Earl Shirk, G. L. 
Taylor, H. L. Vincent, Frank 
Patterson and H. M. Williams.

Attend Art 
Exhibition

Mrs. Kenneth Kendrick, Mrs. 
Newton Crabtree, Mrs. Martha 
Harrison, Mrs. Melvin Phillips, 
and Mrs. Sarah Lou Lasley at­
tended the OPPINI Academy of 
Fine Arts exhibition of paint­
ings in the Panhandle Plains 
Museum in Canyon Thursday of 
last week. They also attended 
a meeting of the Area Arts 
Foundation in the Dord Fitz 
studio in Amarillo. Pictures 
exhibited in the New York art 
show were exhibited.

I will continue writing State 
Farm Insurance although I am 
K̂ orking at the Sherman County 
Abstract Co. — Mrs. R. B. Ter­
rell. 30-tfc

SEWING, plain or fancy, but­
tonholes, self covered buttons, 
belts, alterations, dresses. If its 
sewing, we’ll do it. See Mrs. 
Gladys Kirkwood at Nina’s 
Souvenir & Gift Shop, Phone 
2851. 21-tfc

FREE Removal of dead stock. 
Call 3736 Stratford, or DR 2-3655 
Amarillo Collect. — Amarillo 
Rendering Co. 23-tfc

WILL BUY any old coins. 
Large cents. Small cents. In­
dian head cents. Silver or gold 
coins. — Tommie Garoutte, 
Phone 2242 or 2151. 29-2tp

Lost
STRAYED from Vernon Mor­

ris place, red steer calf, banded 
“d” on right hip. Call 8-1432 
Sunray, Texas. 29-3tp

Pets
TO GIVE Away — Kittens. — 

W. D. Heil. 29-3tp
It’s a real friend who likes you 

in spite of all he knows about 
you.

Bill Pendleton
Your Home Town 
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Box 406 ------ Stratford. Texas
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Mrs. W. T. Martin 
Honored With Dinner 
On Birthday

Mrs. W. T. Martin was honor­
ed with a birthday dinner Sat­
urday evening by her daughters, 
Mrs. Arthur King and Mrs. Earl 
Riffe, in the home of Mrs. Riffe.

Lloyd King showed pictures 
which were taken during his 
European town which were es­
pecially enjoyed.

Those attending the dinner 
were: Mrs. Martin, the honoree, 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Watkins, 
Charles and Chris of Corpus 
Chisti, Texas, Mr. and Mrs. 
Conrad Riffe and Bryant, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Riffe, Earl Riffe, 
Arthur King, Lloyd King and 
the hostesses, Mrs. King and 
Mrs. Riffe.

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Hudson are 
the parents of a seven pound 
fourteen ounce daughter, 
Martha Elizabeth. She was
born July 17 in Northwest Tex­
as Hospital in Amarillo. Her 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
J. B. Riley of Tishomingo, Okla­
homa and Mr. and Mrs. Eugene 
Hudson of Stratford.

APPRECIATION
I wish to express my thanks to 

my Stratford friends for the 
many, many messages, cards, 
gifts and flowers I have received 
from them. I love the Stratford 
people. Your kindness will al­
ways be a pleasant memory. I 
am now at home at 1242 College 
Street in Bowling Green, Ken­
tucky.
Mrs. V. O. (Aunt Esma) Gilbert

THE STATE OF TEXAS
TO ANY SHERIFF OR CON­

STABLE WITHIN THE STATE 
OF TEXAS — GREETING:

You are hereby commanded 
to cause to be published, ONCE, 
not less than ten days before 
the return day thereof, exclu­
sive of the date of publication, 
in a newspaper printed in Sher­
man County, Texas, the 
accompanying citation, of which 
the herein below following is a 
true copy — (but if there is no 
newspaper so printed in said 
county, then that you cause the 
said citation to be posted for at 
least TEN days before the re­
turn date thereof as required by 
law.)
CITATION BY PUBLICATION
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO ELIZABETH EATON and 
  Eaton, her hus­

band, and if dead, their un­
known heirs, and unknown 
legal representatives together 
with their unknown heirs 
and unknown le­
gal representatives and all per­
sons interested in the ESTATE 
OF RAY FREI, deceased.

You and each of you are 
hereby commanded to appear 
before the County Court of

Weeh^

*‘Jpst look at that moon! . . .  Doesn’t it make you want to get rifiit 
hpiqe aftd wpr| fis a racket shipr*

Sherman County, Texas, to be 
held at the courthouse of said 
county in the City of Stratford, 
Sherman County, Texas, at or 
before 10:00 o’clock A. M. of 
the first Monday after the ex­
piration of ten days from the 
date of issuance hereof; that is 
to say, at or before 10:00 o ’clock 
A. M. on Monday the 1st day of 
August, 1960, and answer the 
petition of ANNA HELEN, 
GEORGE HENEFORTH, ED 
HEIEN, DORA HEIEN TULLIS, 
CARL HEIEN, !^LMER HEIEN, 
JOHN L. HEIEN, DOVIE PERRY, 
executrix of the Estate of ANNIS 
HELEN, EDWIN SCHWARZ, 
CAROLINE SCHWARZ MORRI­
SON, HOWARD HEIEN, DOR­
OTHY HEIEN, KATHERINE 
MILLER in Cause Number 978 
styled In the Matter of the Es­
tate of R. F. Frei, Deceased, 
which petition was filed in said 
court on the 19 day of July, 
1960, and the nature of which is 
an action to determine heir­
ship and distribute estate, and 
the description of the property 
involved and the interest of the 
said unknown heirs is as fol­
lows, to-wit:

An undivided interest in and 
to the hereinafter described real 
and personal property of R. F. 
Frei, deceased.

Petitioners file such action to 
declare heirship under the pro­
visions of Article 48-56 of the 
Texas Probate Code and prays 
for judgment of the court de­
claring the petitioners to be the 
only heirs at law of Ray Frei, 
deceased intestate, and that the 
interest of petitioners, as the 
only heirs at law, in the real 
and personal property of such 
decedent is an undivided one- 
e l e v e n t h  t o  e a c h  
p e t i t i o n e r  in the 
following described property:

All of the South One-Half 
(SV2 ) of Section No. Ninety- 
Three (93), Block One-C (1C), 
G. H. & H. Ry. Co., Sherman 
County, Texas;

All of the South One-Half 
(SV2 ) of Section One hundred 
Twenty-Four (124), Block No. 
One-C (1C), G. H. & H. Ry Co., 
Sherman County, Texas;

All of the Northeast One- 
Fourth (NEt4) of Section No. 
One Hundred Fifty-Five (155), 
Block One-C (1C), G. H. & H. 
Ry. Co., in Sherman County, 
Texas;

All personal property consist­
ing of farm tools, household 
goods, and various stocks and 
bonds.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after date of 
its issuance, it shall be return-

QUALITY
¥@i

con measure

ed unserved.
The officer executing this 

writ shall promptly serve the 
same according to requirements 
of law, and the mandates here­
of, and made due return as the 
law directs.

Issued and given under my 
hand and seal of said court a t ' 
Stratford, Texas, this the 19 
day of July, A. D., 1960.

ATTEST: LELAH BONEY 
Clerk, County Court 
Sherman County, Texas 

(Seal)
By PAULINE JONES 

Deputy
(Pub. 7-21)

How times change! Nowa­
days when the doctor finds a 
patient in a run-down condi­
tion, he prescribes less golf and 
more time at the office.

Car Doctors

C A R  A C T S  S I C K ?  
LET US MAKE IT WELL!

We are wise old birds when it comes to doctoring sick 
automobiles------should be, we’ve had the training and ex­
perience. If your car is limping along, bring it in to us 
for a checkup and a tune-up.

We Will Put Your Car In A -l 
Shape Fast

Garrison Motor Co.
Chrysler and Plymouth Cars

T h r i f t
F I R S T —

With Business

F I R S T —
With Farmers

F I R S T —
With Working People

The First State Bank of Stratford is increasingly the 
choice of Stratford’s business community. It is growing 
with Stratford business for many reasons; and the biggest 
reason is that The First State Bank of Stratford is known 
as the Bank of Friendly Service. In addition, we are skill­
ed and experienced in our business which is helping your 
business in money management. And that is just one of the 
ways we can help your business to prosper and grow.

We should like to tell you more about the many services 
we perform for business people. Some of them are unique 
in this community. Won’t you come in and let us get ac­
quainted with you?

The First State Bank
OF S T R A T F O R D

Your Deposits Insured Up To $10,000 By Federal Deposit
Insurance Corporation
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iTwo Girls Enroll 
In University 
Of Washington

Linda Riffe and Mary Sue 
Taylor left Friday night for 
Seattle, Washington where they 
have enrolled in the Univerity 
of Washington for the second 
semester of the summer session.

Art Association 
Elects Officers

New officers were elected at a 
regular meeting of the Tri- 
Corner Art Association at 2:00 
p. m. July 13 in the County Ex­
hibit Building. Mrs. Newton 
Crabtree was reelected president, 
and others elected were Mrs. 
Shuler Donelson, vice-president; 
Mrs. Frank Ross, secretary- 
treasurer, and Mrs. Melvin Phil­
lips, reporter.

Tentative plans were made for 
the coming year.

Church of Christ
(Vernon Williams, Minister) 

Sunday Services 
Bible Study 10:00 a. m. 
Worship 10:55 a, m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p. m. 

Tuesday
Ladies class 9:30 a. m. 

Wednesday 
Bible study 7:00 p. m.
A friendly welcome awaits you 

at all services.

CARD OF THANKS
Dear friends, we wish to 

thank each of you from the bot­
tom of our hearts for the many 
flowers, cards, thoughtful deeds, 
and kind words which we re­
ceived following the loss of our 
Mother and Grandmother, Mrs, 
P. J. Pederson, May God bless 
each of you.
-Our deepest gratitude.

The Jodie Reesing Family

A life-sized statue of Popeye, 
the sailorman of newspaper 
cartoon fame, stands at Crystal 
City, south of Uvalde, in South­
west Texas.

Assembly Of God 
Church

(Rev. J. O. Brown. Pastor) 
Sunday School 10:00 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m. 
Young People 6:00 p. m. 
(Children’s Church 6:00 p. m. 
Evangelistic Service 7:00 p. 

m.
Wednesday night service 8.00 

p. m.
The public is invited to all 

services.

Methodist Church
(Rev. Raymond T. Dyess, Pastor)

Sunday School 9:45 a. m.
Morning worship 11:00 a. m.
M.y.P. 6:00 p. m.
Intermediate Fellowship 6:00 

p. m.
Junior additional session 6:00 

p. m.
Evening worship 7:00 p. m. 
Wesleyan Guild meets second 

Wednesday of each month at 
7:30 p. m.

Choir practice: First and 
third Wednesday of each month, 
7:30 p. m.

Official board meetings and 
all commissions second Wednes­
day of each month, 7:30 p. m.

at the church.
W.S.C.S. Meetings: Third

Wednesday of each month at 
the church at 2:30 p. m.

Circles meet the first Wednes­
day of ^each month; Mary Ethel 
Circle at 9:30 a. m.. Flora Fore­
man Circle at 2:30 p. m., Flor­
ence Mullins Circle at 9:30 a. m.

Methodist Men meet the 
fourth Wednesday night of each 
month at 7:00 p. m.

MYF council meetings: First 
Sunday of every third month at 
5:00 p. m.

FIRST

Christian Church
(B. R. Clark, Minister)

Sunday School 9:45 a. m. 
Morning worship 10:45 a. m. 
Youth groups 6:00 p. m. 

Evening Worship 7:00 p. m. 
Mid-week Bible Study and 

prayer 7:00 p. m.
A friendly welcome awaits 

you at any service of the First 
Christian Church.

S A L E
S U M M E R  C L E A R A N C E

on
Girls and Boys 

C L O T H I N G
STARTING JULY 25

T O T  and BUTTON SHOP
Dalhart, Texas

Baptist Church
(M. E. Upchurch, Pastor) 

Sunday School 10:00 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m. 
Training Union 6:30 p. m. 
Evening Worship 7:30 p. m. 
Mid-week prayer service 7:00 

p. m. Wednesday.

Catholic Chapel
(Rev. James W. Sonderman, 

Mission Pastor, Phone 
Dalhart, OH9-4128 

Sundays
Mass 8:00 a. m.
Confession 7:40 a. m. 
Teachers Training Course 3:00 

p. m.
Saturdays

Children’s catechism 3:00 p.
m.

To The People 
Of The 18th 
District

(By Walter Rogers)
Paying The Price

The national figures for the 
1960 census will tell a story that 
most of us have known for some 
time. In what may well be the 
greatest and most significant 
American migration in recent 
history, millions of people are

“Thanks to our 
ELECTRIC

clothes dryer, we 
have our own park 
and playground!”

Mrs. James E. W alker
3111-40th S T R E E T  
L U B B O C K , T E X A S

So many, many homemakers depend on Reddy Kilo­
watt to lighten their chores with the four basic appli­
ances; range, freezer, clothes dryer and dishwasher. 
The Walkers are another 4-appliance family who 
especially make good use o f the space saving electric

clothes dryer. Here’s what they say, “Our electric 
clothes dryer helps make it possible for us to have 
cmr own park and playground in the back yard. We 
have no clothes lines to take up valuable space ■—> and 
whoever heard of a clothes line in the middle o f apadr?”

W A T C H  A N D  W I N I
W ATCH A N D  W IN  of your Reddy Kilowatt dealer. It*$ fun, it’s easy! Just ask 

for a  demonstration on one or oil of the four featured electric appliances —  range, clothes 

dryer, dishwasher or food freezer. Then register for each demonstration you receive. Two of these 

featured appliances will be given away this month.

$^E YOUR PARTIOPATING 
REPDY K ILOW AH 

ELECTRIC 
APPLIANCE DEALER

SOUTHWESTERN

P U B LIC  SER VIC E

PRODDING THE PACHYDERM
NlVLOM

r O f» A T > » U  I.

Greatest number of accidents
caused by tractors overturn­
ing occur while the tractors are 
being operated on level ground.

Today’s farms are becoming 
more like small industrial plants 
and they have some of the same 
safety needs.

forsaking the farm and cross­
roads to stream toward the 
great urban centers of our na­
tion. And at least by the time 
children of these restless, mo­
bile Americans reach high 
school, a map of the United 
States will be covered with 
huge welt-like markings to de­
note the most complex and awe­
some cities the world has ever 
known. Many of these city 
dwellers will work and play in 
“towns” which range across 
hundreds of miles without in­
terruption.

The trend has been obvious in 
many ways. The most casual 
glance at wedding announce­
ments in Panhandle newspapers 
will reveal that many young 
couples choose to abandon their 
home towns in favor of larger 
cities. An hour in the bus and 
railroad stations of a large me­
tropolis will uncover a portion 
of the millions who set out for 
the big city each year with their 
high hopes, and often their ev­

ery possession, carried with 
them. Just a short ride along 
the outskirts of even a moder­
ately large community will un­
cover row upon row of mass 
produced, FHA financed homes, 
the hallmark of sprawling su­
burbia.

These are the hard facts of 
an important feature in Amer­
ican life since World War n. In 
some ways, the massive “urge to 
move” is perhaps inspiring in­
sofar as it demonstrates that we 
have not lost the pioneering 
spirit which made America 
great. Our people still have 
the courage to venture into new 
environments and test new 
ways. Many of them, I am sure, 
are hopeful of benefiting their 
countrymen as well as them­
selves. We are not, as our 
enemies would have us believe, 
such an entirely contented and 
declining nation at all.

Nevertheless, the uncomfort-
(Continued on Page 6)

Spray Now
WEEDS and HOPPERS

Consult Us On Your Spray Needs

$1.00 PER ACRE
Plus Chemicals

DUMAS
Phone

Webster
5-9944

DALHART
Phone

Chestnut
9-2406

AMARILLO
Phone
Drake
3-8840

Please Call Your Nearest

Plains Aero Service Ag Agent
DELMER M. MIIXER — OWNER

OR STOP THE
YELLOW AND BLUE TRUCKS

C A L L  S T R A T F O R D  
B U T A N E  CO.  
Phone-- - - -5 0 5 1

Paul Chesmer, Local Representative

COMPANY

Medium-duty models have stronger frames and springs for longer life, wider cabs for more comfort

UP ON VALUE...DOWN ON THE FARM
“Hard Road” or “Back Road,” In t e r n a t i o n a l  Trucks can take it 
They’re capable of transporting big loads at valuable savings in any 
kind of weather. V-8 engines are standard. Provide greater power 
...with amazing gas mileage. See us about trucks...we know!

King Equipment Co.
Phone 2221 Stratford, Texas

INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS WORLD’S MOST 
COMPLETE LINE
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® Pioneers
(Continued from Page 1)

ed two beautiful piano numbers 
by Chopin.

The Sunny Side Quartet, Arlie 
Green of Sunray, John D. King, 
Charlie S. Downing, and Howard 
Stewart all of Dumas, gave 20 
minutes of enjoyable songs.

After a short talk by Neal 
Spurlock, master of ceremonies, 
the congregation sang, “God Be 
With You,” and the Rev. D. D. 
Creecy pronounced the benedic­
tion.

Those signing the guest book 
were as follows:

Mr. and Mrs. R. S. Huenefeld 
and family of Cactus; Mr. and 
Mrs. R. M. Bretz, Cactus; Mr. and 
Mrs. Stanley Levell and family, 
Fort Worth; Rev. and Mrs. D. D. 
Oeecy, Cactus; David Flyr, 
Cedar Hill; Mr. and Mrs. J. D. 
Hester and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Corum Dortch, Mr. and Mrs. 
Byron Fedric, Mrs. Arthur Fol­
som, Mrs. J. B. Stublefield, Mr.

and Mrs. Forrest Mullins, Mrs. 
Eunice Buster, Mr. and Mrs. N. 
W. Hudson and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Eugene Hudson, Mr. and 
Mrs. Owen E. Hudson and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Verne Foreman 
and family, Mrs. Elizabeth Cum­
mings, Mrs. Belle Cum­
mings, Mrs. Lois M. Holmes, Mr. 
and Mrs. Arthur Mullins, Dan 
Foreman, Mrs. E. F. Spurlock, 
Mr. and Mrs. Qma Ellison, Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Hudson, all of 
Stratford; Mr. and Mrs. John 
Dortch, Arvada, Colorado; Mr. 
and Mrs. Mack Dortch, Morse; 
Mr. and Mrs. Clarence Todd, 
Tulia; Mrs. Harvey Spurlock, 
Mrs. W. A. Spurlock, Mr. and 
Mrs. Arthur Cartrite, Mr. and 
Mrs. Guy R. Sweny, Mr. and 
Mrs. Arlie Green, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. T. Cartrite, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Cartrite and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. E. E. DeBusk, all of 
SunTiay; MJrs. Nellie For)eman 
Ashby and Mrs. Stella Foreman 
Shaw, both of Escondido, Cali­
fornia; Mrs. Remer Fedric, 
Theresa Fedric, Mr. and Mrs.

4• •

ABSTRACTS
WE HAVE A COMPLETE 

ABSTRACT PLANT
Covering All Real Estate In  ̂

Sherman County
We Furnish Quick Efficient Service 

On Short Notice

Sherman County Abstract Co.
Royal Pendleton, Manager Stratford, Texas v

John*s
H U M B L E  S E R V I C E

On U. S. Highway 54 East
OFFERS YOU SATISFACTORY SERVICE WITH

HUMBLE GASOLINES 
O I L S  of all kinds

A t t r a c t i v e  S o u v e n i r s

Olace Hicks and Mr. and Mrs. 
S. M. Fedric and family, all of 
Clarendon; Mr. and Mrs. George 
Cummings and family of Okla­
homa City; Mr. and Mrs. Arrell 
Cummings, Childress; Mr. and 
Mrs. Hugh Stewart and sons, 
Stinnett; Mr. and Mrs. J. B. 
Hullum and David, Lubbock; 
Miss Jean Spurlock, D. A. Ends- 
ley, C. F. Moon and Gib Lan­
dis of Amarillo; Mrs. Bennie E. 
Ford and children, J. D. King, 
Charlie S. Downing, Howard 
Stewart, Mr. and Mrs. W. E. 
Lawley and Mr. and Mrs. Homer 
Foreman of Dumas; Mr. and 
Mrs. Charlie Flyr, Shamrock; 
Curtis L. Spurlock and son. Cac­
tus; Duane Tinkler, El Paso; 
Mrs. Daisy Ashby Stenraas, Mo­
desto, California; Mrs. Jessie 
Mathews, Greensburg, Kansas; 
Mr. and Mrs. Marion Foreman, 
Linda, Cathy and Jane Cross­
land, Plain view; Mr. and Mrs. 
E. T. Fedric, Lawrence Ashby, 
Ebert Ashby and Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Lasley and family of 
Dalhart; Gary Moore, Miss Ann 
Richardson, Vigo Park; Mrs. 
Bonnie Flyr, Cedar Hill; Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene French and family, 
Raton, New Mexico; Mr. and 
Mrs. Emmit Oldaker, Texhoma; 
Mrs. Emma Simpson, Jake Mey­
ers, Mr. and Mrs. Alvin B. 
Spurlock, Kay and Boyd, Mr. 
and Mrs. H. A. Carter, Mr. and 
Mrs. E. W. Carter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Travis Spurlock, James and 
Elaine, Mr. and Mrs. Meritt 
Sweny, Mr. and Mrs. D. S. Boone, 
Sidney L. Anthes, Mr. and Mrs. 
L. M. Fedric, Mrs. Edith Smith, 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Carter and 
Bill, Mr. and Mrs. Bob Wegner 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. Neal 
Spurlock and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Don Ellison and family, all 
of the Spurlock Community.

State Capital 
Highlights

(By Vem Sanford)
Although budget balancing is 

the most discussed of the prob­
lems facing the next Legislature, 
many lawmakers expect redis­
tricting wrangles may raise more 
blood pressures.

Legislature is required by the 
Constitution to redefine legis­
lative districts after each fed­
eral census. It used to put off 
this troublesome task, but a 1948 
law provides that if it fails to 
act in the first session after a

census, a Legislature Redistrict­
ing Board shall take over.

This insures, as it did in 1951, 
that the Legislature will redis­
trict — somehow, some way.

Battle will be between big city 
delegations who will demand 
more representation in line with 
their swelling populations and 
rural members who will try to 
hold on to as much as they can.

In their election compaigns, 
many representatives promised 
their constitutents they’d be in 
there pitching for the home 
area. Members from growth 
areas said they’d go after extra 
representatives, state senators 
and congressmen.

A rural legislator told his peo­
ple, “At least twelve rural dis­
tricts will disappear in the next 
redistricting. I certainly do not 
want this district included in 
that twelve.”

Incumbents cited their exper­
ience as an asset. Personal 
feeling often enters into redis­
tricting, and lawmakers are no­
tably reluctant to “squeeze out” 
a popular and respected senior 
colleague by erasing his dis­
trict.

Home Insurance Cut
Beginning August 1, premium 

rates on certain types of home- 
owmer’s insurance policies will 
be cut 10 per cent.

State Insurance Board an­
nounced the new lower rates 
would apply to the “homeown­
ers package” policies which ac­
count for about 80 per cent of 
the home coverage sold in Tex­
as.

Reductions were made pos­
sible because insurance com­

panies have had a relatively low 
loss ratio on the package poli­
cies, first introduced about three 
years ago.

Credit Rate Eyed 
Board of Insurance also is 

considering a further lowering 
(Continued on Page 6)

Long Life Dependable

Willard Batteries
12, 24, 36 and 48 Month Guarantees

EQUIP YOUR CAR FOR DEPENDABLE HOT WEATHER 
DRIVING

GULFPRIDE MOTOR OILS 
GULF INSECT SPRAYS

DRIVE IN TODAY AT THE

GULF S UPER S E R V I C E
PHILLIP BAIN

mamsusB&ms

Doherty Weed 
Control

Work Guaranteed
LET DOHERTY SOLVE YOUR

BI NDWEED P R O B L E M S
BEFORE SIGNING A CONTRACT, CHECK WITH US ON 

OUR TWO-PLAN PROPOSITION

CALL J. W. GUNNELS
W E  5-2451 Dumas, Texas

OR C. C. PLUNK, YOUR LOCAL AGENT 
PLUNK 66 OIL COMPANY

P. O. BOX 848 PHONE 2661 STRA'TFORD

Not a single cracked 
egg since Chevy 
took over the route
That ’60 Fleetside pickup you see takes 
whatever kind of road comes along, 
and makes about 250 stops a day de~ 
livering eggs house to house for Mr. 
Harry Hansen of Missoula, Montana. 
“With my previous truck,” Mr. Hansen 
writes, “J always had some cracked 
eggs. Cargo damage always cut into my 
profits. But the new Chevy eliminated 
that problem completely. I haven’t had 
one cracked egg with my new truck 
and Tve had up to a ton of eggs in it 
without any difficulty. . . .  I  didn’t know 
a truck could ride so nice.”

Chevy rides nice, all right: takes good 
care of fragile cargoes. But that’s not even 
the half of it. Torsion-spring suspension 
also means longer life for the truck, extra 
thousands of working miles, because the 
sheet metal and body components take less 
of a beating. You can run off-the-road or 
over back trails at faster safe speeds, too; 
get in more trips a day, make more money. 
Those facts are as true of the big Chevrolet 
heavyweights as they are of the pickups. 
Any model you name. Get one on your job 
and you’ve got the world’s most eflBcient, 
most economical way to haul any load 
over any road. Your dealer will be happy 
to prove that statement any day you say.

“I’m getting close to 20 miles to the gallon,” 
Mr. Hansen states, “and that’s on stop-and- 
go delivery.”

WORTH MORE BECAUSE THEY WORK MORE! CHEVROLET STURDI-BILTTRUCKS
See your local authorized Chevrolet dealer

TAKE i r _  _ _ __  Before
YOUR Vacation School Starts

Take Your Equipment and Get Out Into The Hills and 
Streams. The rest will do you good and the expense will be 
very reasonable.

Davis Motor Co.
NORTH SECOND AND MAIN STRATFORD, TEXAS PHONE 3191

DUTCH OVENS
POTS and PANS

\

Coleman Stoves 
Coleman Lanterns

Camp Chairs
CANTEENS 

WATER BAGS 
Thermos Jugs 
ICE CHESTS

T a r p a u l i n s

Sleeping Bags 
Army Cots -  Tents 

FISHING TACKLE
LEVI PANTS and 

S H I R T S
COWBOY BOOTS
Indian Moccasins

For Men, Women and Children

DUFFLE BAGS 
SUIT CASES 

FOOT LOCKERS

Van B. Boston s t r a d in g  p o s t
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T H E  S T R E E T S  ARE NO 
P L A C E  FOR A  H O R S E  
TO P A V ,-TH IS  AFTERNOON 
ITA L A A O S -T  W E N T

''I used to Get 
Them Fixed 

UP THE
STREET THERH^

All of our custom­
ers are particular, 
that’s why they’re
OURS!

PHONE -

A T L A S
V Plycron

and
Bucron

T I R E S
Guaranteed a- 
gainst all road 

hazards.
Ride on Atlas 

Tires and pay on­
ly for the time you 

use them.
We stock a good supply of 
all sizes of tires. Drive 
in today for a new set of 
ATLAS TIRES.

—  3351

Darrell Cotney, Manager

v-li

0 Ship and 
travel 

Santa Fe
...the longest 
railroad in 
the U. S. A.

See your nearest Santa Fe agent

GAS-TOONS

• State Capita
(Continued from Page 5) 

of credit insurance rates.
The Board says that even now 

rates seem high, with losses run­
ning 27 per cent of the prem­
iums paid in. If losses run less 
than 50 per cent of the prem­
iums, rates are considered too 
high.
Speaker’s Battle Boils

Candidates for Speaker of the 
House continue their months- 
long battle of “claimsmanship.”

Rep. Wade Spilman added five 
to his list of House members 
pledged to support him and said 
this gave him a “rather conclu­
sive” lead. Rep. James Tur­
man of Gober claims a defin­
ite majority of 79.

Votes of 76 of the 150 House 
members are needed to elect.

Spilman also has invited the 
House General Investigating 
Comrhittee to look into charges 
that members were being sub­
jected to improper pressure on 
how to vote.
Prison Needs Cited

Texas Board 'of Corrections 
also wants more money — a 
$2,654,846 increase over their 
present allocation for the next 
two years.

“If the amount is granted, 
Texas prisoners will cost the 
state $1.89 per day per man,” 
said State Prison Director O. B. 
Ellis. “This is just a little 
more than half the national av­
erage.”

Ellis and Corrections Board 
members regard prison needs as 
critical. Board Chairman H. K. 
Coffield of Rockdale reported 
that “the prison population 
trends indicate it will keep on 
multiplying.”

• Curbing Farm
(Continued from Page 1)

crease.
There are more than four 

times as many accidental deaths 
in farming than in manufactur­
ing. Today’s farms are becom­
ing more like small industrial 
plants, and they have some of 
the same safety needs.

• Polio Cases
((Continued from Page 1)

protected. A fourth “booster” 
shot is recommended for added 
protection.

• Correction
Pam Bennett, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. Harold Bennett, 
won second place in the Sher­
man County 4-H Club girls 
dress revue by modeling a 
housecoat she had made. Ellen 
Dyess won second place in her 
class, and due to an error, was 
listed second place winner in 
the revue.

• To The People
(Continued from Page 4) 

able feeling remains that much 
of this surging movement to­
ward our urban complexes is in­
spired by rather grandiose pro­
paganda. To say that our 
smaller communities offer no 
opportunities is, in most cases, 
sheer fiction. To complain 
that the more rural areas of 
our country are “dull” displays 
an unpleasant modem neurosis, 
an unhealthy grasping for 
“something to do” and a strange 
inability to find it. And to 
paint universally rosy pictures 
of life in the metropolis is par­
ticularly deceptive, for the in­
dividual tragedies that can 
sometimes occur are as old as O. 
Henry’s writings.

Old men whittling in front of 
the country store are as much a 
part of America as the high 
pressure brokers on Wall Street. 
We should be as proud of the 
kindly old general practitioner 
as we are of the most eminent 
heart specialist. And the man 
who rides a tall, bumpy tractor 
has fully as much stake in the 
American experiment as does 
the man who rides from direc­
tors meeting to directors meet­
ing in a low, smooth limousne.

We have, I think, committed

DINOSAURS ONCE 
ROAMED TEXAS

Prehistoric dinosaurs once 
roamed Texas. Just 20 miles 
west of Cleburne at the town of 
Glen Rose, you can find fos­
silized dinosaur tracks along 
the beautiful Paluxy River. 
They have a fine specimen on 
exhibit downtown too.

Glen Rose is a vacation health 
spot, famous for it mineral wa­
ter.

OUT ON A LIMB . , . Beth 
Lanche isn’t walking on water 
at Cypress Gardens, Fla., but 
merely holding on to the limb of 
a waterlogged palm tree.

a fundamental error in empha­
sizing a certain brand of success 
all out of proporition to its true 
worth. We have too often 
dwelt upon the slick, the super- 
sophisticated, the “gee-whiz” 
type of endeavor. We have 
sometimes been willing to ex­
change quick, easy fame and 
success for slow, difficult, but 
profound satisfaction. This 
attitude has not been without 
effect.

We are now beginning to pay 
the price, and the amazing rush 
of so many of our people to ur­
ban areas is i>erhaps not the 
only toll. The source of many 
of our worries, such as conform­
ity or trend toward bureaucracy, 
can also be traced to a shift in 
values. We would do well to

S U R E T Y  . B O N D E D

r  . T E R M I T E  
C O N T R O L

S I N C E  1901

Call Collect 
BB 4-26U 
BORGER

WORLD'S l a r g e s t

JU L Y  22,162.0: pURlTAblS 
S A ILE P  FR OM  HOUU^^^D. 
JU LV 2 5 ,1 88 6 -. S T E V E  
^ROPlE JUMPS FP;ON\ 
BROOKLYN B R ID G E .

JU LY 24.1704; G IB R A L TA R  
T A K E N  B Y ENGLISH FROfA 
S P A I N .
J U L Y  2 .5 ,1775-- BEH FRANKLIN . 
NAWEP FIRST POSTMASTER GENERAL J

JULY 2 7 ,1 8 6 6 : A TU AN TIC  
CABLE COMPLETED.

J U L Y  28,1932.*
BREAK UP WA^
B O N U S M A R C l

remember that American 
strength lies to a great extent 
in its diversity and depth. The 
1960 census, in revealing a par­

tial loss of this vigrant quality, 
might well remind us of our duty 
to keep faith with all facets of 
our life.

Stratford Abstract Co.
Minnie Laura Jackson, President

Incorporated 1907 — 53 years of Satisfactory Service 
to Sherman County Land Owners

Let Us Make Your Abstracts
WE SHOW THE RECORDS

OFFICE IN AMERICAN LEGION BUILDING

It’ s Simple Arithmetic
EVERYBODY KNOWS 2 AND 2 ARE 4,

And Its Just That Easy To Add Up The 
Advantages of Shopping at Albert’s.

Tuesday -  DOUBLE STAMPS 
with $2.50 cash purchase

or More. Plus Tuesday Specials.

Fry
u. s. D. A.

ers
Fresh Dressed —  Pound

P O R K
Pound

BE EF  R I B S
Pound 29
WIENERS -  Pinkney 
3 pound package

Oleo
COLORED QUARTERS
5 Pounds for

Fresh Tomatoes
No. 1 California
POUND

C A N T A L O U P E S
No. 1 California
POUND

NEW POTATOES
2 pound cello, bag

WILSON
GOLDEN
BRAND

LB. — 16̂ 5

P U R E  L A R D
SWIFT
1 Pound Carton

C E L E R Y  H E A R T S
CALIFORNIA PASCAL
Cello. Bag

Coffee
HILLS BROS.
POUND

Frozen Orange Juice
DONALD DUCK
6 Oz. Tin 19

VIENNA SAUSAGE
KIMBELL’S
Regular Size Can

JACK MACKEREL

PINEAPPLE JUICE
CONCHO
46 Oz. T in -----29^
3  cans for

Sweep Stake
TALL TIN

C O R N  — Concho
Cream Style — White — Or Golden
No. 303 Tin
i cans for

1 5 ^

Pineapple-Grapefruit
||T | /̂ |7 DEL MONTE

J U I t t  46 Oz. T in -29^
3  cans for
S L I C E D  A P P L E S

Early JUNE PEAS
Pecan Valley — Cooked — Dried
No. 300 T in -----13<
3  cans for

KIMBELL’S
No. 2 Tin 19
P I N E A P P L E
DIAMOND SLICED
No. 2 Tin 31

D O G  F O O D T E X I Z E — Texy
KIM TALL CAN
12 Cans for

9t LIQUID FOR DISHES
Large 22 Oz.

11̂  OFF 59
ALBERT’S GROCERY
& MARKET - - Phone 4821


