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Students Appear In 
School Week Program

The First Grade Rhythm 
' Band, Second Grade Chorus,
. Grade School Band and High 
School Band appeared on the 

 ̂ Public School Week Program at 
' the school auditorium Tuesday 
. night. The first and second
■ grade groups were under the di­

rection of Mrs. Lorraine Mehner. 
Joe Mack Hill directed the grade 
and high school bands.

The First Grade Rhythm Band 
, is composed of Lynda Bain, Mary 

Bateman, Richard Blake, Perry 
Broderick, Daniel Brooks, Ear­
nest Chavez, Richard Collins, 
Deborah Cook, Mickey Davis, 
Phyllis Farris, Paul Gunzelman, 
Cathy Gurley, Larry Hampton, 
Barry Harris, O. J. Heil, Frances 
Houk, Paula Howard, Lisa Hud­
son, Von Dell Kimball, Rene

■ Knight, Griffith Lasley, John 
Xiavake, Carlos Lopez, Victor Mc- 
Xtoniel, Tresa McDonald, Daryl 
Miller, Albert Miranda, Jeanie 
Naylor, Billy Parrish, Tommy 
Pendleton, Ronnie Pool, Freddy 
Pronger, Martha Lee Pronger, 
Glenda Reed, Debbie Robbins, 
Clarice Royal, Barry Smith, 
Debra Smith, Helen Stephen­
son, John Stewart, Wilma Stone, 
Preda Williams and Bill Zim­
mer.

Personnel of the Second Grade 
Chorus includes: Kathy Allen,

‘ Paulette Bardwell, Steven Bas­
kin, Carolyn Sue Blades, Neta 
Brannan, Barbara Clark, Harry 
Clements, Colleen Coffman, Ke­
vin Cummings, Jeff Davis, 
Nancy Davis, Ricky Davis, An­
drea Dettle, Floyd Ellison, Ste­
phen Gunzelman, Mary Gupton, 
Randy Gurley, Becky Guthrie, 
Youlanda Harris, Jeff Hart, 
Claudia Heil, Carla Hester, Mark 
Hudson, Pat Hudson, Mary C. 
James, Mary Faith Judd, Grant 
Keener, Ben Korte, Mark Lamb, 
Cindy Laird, Joy Lewis, Patti 
McDaniel, Shirley McRae, Mary 
Pat Martin, Wayne Moore, Ann 
Pickens, Phil Plunk, Sue Rob­
erts, Allan Ross, Becky Sanders, 
Doug Taylor, John Upchurch, 
Leslie Wells, Eddie Williams, 
Randy Williams, Rex Williams 
and Andrea Zimmer.

Musicians in the Grade School 
Band are; Connie Garrison, Judy 
Hudson, Lanita Judd, Donna 
Davis, Charlotte Eller, Yvonne 
Gamble, Lorelei Harding, . Ros- 
anne Laird, Marie Moore, Senora 
Mullican, Judy Steinberger, Bet­
ty Valdez, Wynette Morris, Beth 
Naylor, Jeannette Bardwell, Er­
ma Ford, Gloria Wagner, Jack 
Morgan, Sue Plunk, Missie Keen­
er, Dan Newman, Duane Pitt­
man, Billie Robbins, Jack Stan- 
defer. Bob Stone, Sandy Tillery, 
E. H. Baker, Roy Bouldin, Ar­
thur Caraway, Phil Dettle, Pat 
Donelson, Kenny Gupton, Cindy 
Heil, Mary Kaye Keener, Dennis 
Plunk, Linda Plunk, Linda Rees- 
ing, Teddy Reynolds, Mary San­
ders, Kenneth Scott, Louise 
Stone, Charlene Wisdom, Bon­
nie Combs, Reta Jacobs, Lynn 
Allen, Tommy Green, Gary Hud­
son, Donna Moon, Carol Reed­
er, Scott Whorton, Herman 
Borth, Dwayne DeBord, Mike 
Peterson, Bill Kirkwood and Joe 
Minkley.

High School Band members 
are: Jimmy Cameron, Kay Cara­
way, Pat Newman, Ann Bradley, 
Lynda Brewster, Patsy Carri- 
ger, Ray Duncan, Sharon Mulli­
can, Kay Pickens, Jessie Riggs, 
Wanda Preston, Betty Naylor, 
Doris Dortch, Leslie Gay Plunk, 
Ann Burgess, Kaye Webb, Bob­
bie Burgess, Sharon Gamble, 
Martha Stone, Sammie Beall, 
Sue Ellen Flores, Karl Kirkwood, 
Cleo Aduddell, Frankie Aduddell, 
Bobby Benson, Jay Duncan, Joe 
Elms, Kay Jacobs, Barbara Lav- 
ake, Madelene Reesing, Ann Car-

Six Candidates 
Announce For 
School Trustee

Stratford Independent School 
District and Texhoma Indepen­
dent School District each have 
three candidates for the two va­
cancies in the office of school 
trustee to be filled in an elec­
tion to be held Saturday, April 
4.

In the Stratford Independent 
School District, William E. Mar­
tin Jr. has filed as a candidate 
for the office and Kenneth Ken­
drick and B. L. (Chuck) Smith, 
whose terms are expiring, have 
file for re-election.

In the Texhoma Independent 
School District, B. G. Emerson 
has filed for the office of school 
trustee and Ralph Renner and 
L. L. Garrison, whose terms of 
office are expiring, have filed 
for re-election.

Worley Funeral 
Sunday!n 
Wellington

Funeral services for Eli F. 
Worley, 87 year old uncle of L. 
M. Worley, were conducted Sun­
day afternoon in the Faith Bap­
tist Church in Wellington by 
Rev. L. C. Conner, pastor. Mr. 
Worley died at 1:30 a. m. Sat­
urday in Smith Rest Home. He 
was born April 9, 1873 in Coffey- 
ville, Kansas.

Eli F. Worley moved to Col­
lingsworth County as a boy and 
later moved to Union County, 
New Mexico, where he home­
steaded. He returned to Col­
lingsworth County many years 
ago.

Survivors include two daugh­
ters, Mrs. May Kitchen and 
Mrs. Rachel Marie Williams, 
both of Amarillo; three sons, 
Dave, Daniel and Eli Jr., all of 
Amarillo; one brother, W. D. of 
Datil, New Mexico; one sisters, 
Mrs. Ida Powell of Ringling, 
Oklahoma; 15 grandchildren and 
seven great grandchildren.

Burial was made in the Ply­
mouth Cemetery.

Death Ciaims 
R. L. Sanders

R. L. Sanders, 86 year old un­
cle of Mrs. T. S. Bran- 
nan, Mrs. Lewie Brannan and 
Mrs. W. L. Pipkin, died Wednes­
day of last week at his home in 
Anson, Texas following a period 
of eight months of ill health. 
Funeral services were held Fri­
day in the Church Of Christ at 
Anson where burial was made. 
Survivors of the immediate fam­
ily include his wife, one son and 
one daughter.

Mrs. Brannan and Mrs. Pipkin 
attended the funeral and re­
mained for a short visit with 
relatives and many old friends 
they had not seen since they 
were children.

away. Holly Harrington, Gay 
Judd, Angela Teague, Jimmy 
Gore, Neil Harris, Ruthie Ken­
drick, J. D. Plunk, Mary Sue 
Taylor, Joe Brown, Dwayne 
Plunk, Dean Roper, Ray Davis, 
Jimmy Skillin, Hal Bennett, 
Robbye Burkham and Joanne 
Roper.

Grade School 
Boys Win At 
Channing

Stratford grade school basket­
ball boys won the Channing in­
vitation tournament Saturday 
night by defeating Vega in the 
final game by a score of 40 to 15. 
They played four games, defeat­
ing River Road, Hartley, Adrian 
and Vega.'

Doug McBryde and Pat Donel­
son were chosen as members of 
the all-tournament team.

Stratford grade school girls 
lost their second game of the 
tournament to River Road by a 
score of 31 to 32. Yvonne Gam­
ble was named on the girls oH- 
tournament team.

County Gets 
One Drilling 
Location

Announcement is made of the 
location of the Phillips-Massie 
B. No. 1 to be drilled 1,980 feet 
from the south and west lines 
of section 12 in Block 1-T. The 
potential depth of the well is 
3,600 feet. The well is located 
10 miles north and 3 miles west 
of Stratford.
Two Locations In Dallam

O. Gamble No. 1 is located
1.250 feet from the North and 
East lines of section 83 in Block 
1-T. The potential drilling 
depth of the well is 4,000 feet.

Kate Galbraith et al No. 1 is
1.250 feet from the south and 
east lines of section 51 in Block 
1-T. The potential drilling 
depth of the well is 4,000 feet. 
These wells are located, approxi­
mately 10 and 12 miles northwest 
of Stratford.

V .

FRAME-UP . . . Picture-pretty 
Judy Scott is framed at Flori­
da’s Silver Springs where she 
swims and is a high school 
drum majorette.

Band Will Play 
In Festival 
At Sweetwater

The 47-piece Stratford High 
School-Band will leave Friday to 
attend the sixth annual Band 
Festival in Sweetwater, Texas. A 
total of 18 bands were accepted 
as entries in the festival. Four 
of these are Class A bands and 
will be in competition with the 
Stratford Band.

Each band will play three 
numbers and be judged by out­
standing musicians from the 
southwest area. An outstand­
ing band will be selected from 
each classification in concert 
playing, sight reading and 
marching.

The band will return to Strat­
ford Sunday. Plans have been 
made for the band members to 
attend Sunday School and 
church in Snyder on the return 
trip.

Joe Mack Hill, director, and 
four sponsors, will accompany 
the band to Sweetwater.

Suva, the capital of Fiji, is one 
of the busiest cities in the Pacific. 
A center of trade and commerce, 
Suva straddles air and sea lanes 
between Australia and the North 
A m ^ can  continent Its popula­
tion numbers 37,000.

Legislation In Austin 
Concerning High Plains
Pete Bateman 
Resigns At 
Stratford

M. P. (Pete) Bateman, head 
football coach and girls basket­
ball oach at Stratford High 
School, has resigned to go into 
business in Liberal, Kansas. 
Bateman’s father-in-law and 
brother-in-law, operators of a 
large tire store at Liberal were 
both killed last fall in an auto 
accident near Pueblo, Colorado.

Bateman has been in the 
Stratford system four years, first 
as an assistant and the past two 
years as head coach. His foot­
ball record is 16 wins and 3 loss­
es. His team in 1957 won 8 and 
lost 2 ending in a triple tie with 
Groom and Darrouzett for the 
1-B crown. Stratford moved to 
class A and his 1958 team lost to 
Gruver 22-12 for the district 1-A 
title for the only loss last fall. 
His girls basketball teams had a 
50 win against 26 loss record.

The Board of Trustees agreed 
to release Bateman March 1, so 
he could immediately make his 
change. The board regrets to 
lose a nian of Bateman’s caliber. 
Superintendent of Schools R. W. 
Standefer in commenting' on 
Bateman’s loss said, “Bateman 
was an excellent coach, good 
teacher, popular, yet well re­
spected by the students.” Stan­
defer further said, “Bateman 
was not only an excellent coach 
but a man good for the school 
system.”

No immediate successor will 
be named until a later date.

Aggie-Alumni 
Football Game 
March 12

The annual PAMC Aggie- 
Alumni football game will be 
played at Goodwell at 7:45 p. m. 
Thursday, March 12. Carroll 
Gribble, Stratford, will be one of 
the 30 alumni suiting out to play 
against the Aggies.

WIHTER'S LAST SLAP AT SUBURBIA

\

Mildred Crabtree 
Featured On 
Church Program

Miss Mildred Crabtree, Baptist 
missionary, who is leaving this 
month for her fourth tour of 
duty in Africa, was honored 
Sunday evening at the First 
Baptist Church in Dalhart when 
she was featured in a “This Is 
Your Life” program in the 
church sanctuary. A reception 
followed in the church dining 
room..

Miss Crabtree is the daughter 
of Mrs. B. R. Crabtree of Dalhart 
and a sister of Newton Crabtree 
of Stratford.

A gift of matched luggage 
from the society was presented 
to Miss Crabtree by Rev. W. R. 
Lawrence, pastor.

Miss Crabtree worked in the 
AAA office in Dalhart following 
her graduation from Stratford 
High School until she began her 
college work. She attended 
Wayland Junior College in 1941 
and 1942, and was graduated 
from Baylor University in 1944. 
in 1946, she received her Mas­
ter’s degree from the Woman’s 
Missionary Union Training 
School at Louisville, Kentucky.

In 1946, she also received an 
appointment by South Baptist 
Foreign Missionary Board and 
left for the field in Africa in 
January 1947.

She is beginning her return 
trip to Africa March 10 when 
she leaves Amarillo by plane for 
New York. She is scheduled to 
sail from there March 13 on the 
S.S. African Grove. Her work 
is in Nigeria, which is in West 
Africa.

Miss Crabtree is principal of 
Agbor Baptist Girls’ High School. 
Enrollment, she said, was 140 in 
1958. All are boarders, some 
coming as far as 500 miles to go 
to a high school. The teaching 
staff includes two American 
missionaries and six to eight 
Nationals. Other employees are 
a cook and helpers, carpenter, 
painter, tailor and helper, and 
yard worker. She also said 
students there study subjects 
similar to American high school 
students.

Cotney Buys 
Smith Chevron 
Service Station

Darrell Cotney has purchased 
the Smith Chevron Station 
from Edward H. Smith. He 
took over the management of the 
station Monday, which he wiil 
operate under the name of Cot­
ney Chevron Service.

Edward Smith had operated 
the business for the past 51/2 
years. He and Mrs. Smith plan 
to continue making their home 
in Stratford. In the near fu­
ture they plan to announce the 
opening of their new business. 
Smith is in the process of taking 
over the dealership for Case 
farm implements.

Open Store 
In Dalhart

George Jeffcoat attended the 
opening of Wilcoats store in 
Dalhart Monday. Mr. Jeffcoat, 
Guy Williams of Dumas and 
Jerry Williams, manager of the 
store, are associated in the new 
enterprise.

(By J. L. Bass Jr)
The 56th Legislature of the 

State of Texas is less than two 
months under way and to date 
there have been 532 Bills in­
troduced before" the House of 
Representatives and 230 Bills in­
troduced before the Senate. 
These Bills have been referred 
to committees for various 
changes, amendments and ne­
cessary re-writing after count­
less hours of research and re­
ports so that they will best serve 
the needs of the people.

Your representative, J. W. 
Buchanan, has been appointed 
to work on five committees by 
the Speaker of the House of Re­
presentatives, Waggoner Carr, 
from Lubbock. The committees 
are: Appropriations, Conserva­
tion and Reclamation, Highways 
and Roads, Agriculture, and 
Livestock and Stock Raising.

Mr. Buchanan has introduced 
before the House a Bill which 
will correct the surveys in Sher­
man County.

Your representative aside 
from the many hours of other 
committee work has been taking 
part in the hearings before the 
Appropriations Committee. This 
committee hears the various re­
quests from all the organiza­
tions, agencies, hospitals, and 
schools, etc., of the State and 
then an appropriations Bill is 
drafted to try to set a fair and 
equitable appropriation and 
still keep th§ amount low enough 
so that taxes will not have to be 
increased. The hearings have 
now been conducted and soon 
the first draft of the Bill will be 
written and introduced before 
the House of Representatives.

Mr. Buchanan has also intro­
duced House Bill No. 271. This 
Act would validate the Dallam 
County Undeground Water con­
servation District No. 1.

Another Bill of interest to the 
people of the Panhandle was ap­
proved by the Senate State Af­
fairs Committee. It is a bill, 
sponsored by Senator Hazlewood 
of Amarillo, which would en­
able the National Guard Armory 
Board to transfer land to West 
Texas State College. The col­
lege could take over two small 
tracts of land adjoining the 
campus and make way for a new 
road around the campus.

The' Animal Health Council’s 
bills are moving steadily in both 
Houses, House BilJ 151, hog 
feeding, HB 184, bovine TB, and 
HB 31, brucellosis, having all 
passed the House. Senate Bills 
38 and 39, brucellosis and mar­
ket livestock inspection, were 
heard February 24, 1959 and have 
been reported favorably.

Other bills introduced which 
might be of interest were:

SB 177, Willis, unlawful to is­
sue bad check or fraudently 
stop payment.

HB 418, Cowen, certificate of 
title on boat motors.

HB 439, Bridges and eleven 
others, which would end the 
death penalty and make life im­
prisonment the maximum pen­
alty for capital cases.

HB 44, Whitfield, which would 
have the same effect.

HB 75, Anderson and James, 
relating to speed limits on ve­
hicles.

HB 33, Sealigson, would in­
crease certain taxes and repeal 
others.

HB 495, Lewis et al, providing 
that all teachers sign an oath 
that they believe in God before 
being eligible to teach in Public 
School.

HJR 6, Cole et al, could pro­
vide regulation of money len­
ders and interest rates.

HB 375, Parsons, would amend 
(Continued on Page 5)
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Town Talk
Miss Minnie Laura Jackson 

was a business visitor in Ama­
rillo Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Wilson 
and daughters visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Dugger in Dalhart Sunday.

Mrs. Lola Eggers and Mrs. 
George Lovett and Michelle at­
tended the funeral of James J. 
Blanton in Borger Tuesday of 
last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Seig arriv­
ed Monday for a visit with Mrs. 
Seig’s son and daughter-in-law,

■ J Bill Pendleton
Your Home Town 

A U C T I O N E E R  
Box 406 ------ Stratford, Texas

Stratford Maytag 
Laundry

'  HELFT-SELTir SERVICE 
WE DO FINISH WORK 

Pickup and Delivery 
Phone 5416

Located East of Dairy Queen

Have a Good Time
at the

4̂2’ Touraament
and

Auction Sale
Beginning at 7:30 P. M.

Basement Spurlock 
Chapel

Sponsored by Southside Home 
Demonstration Club

Opportunity
FOR AMBITIOUS MEN, 
AGES 17 TO 50, FROM 
NORTHWEST TEXAS 
AREA, IN INDUSTRIAL 
ELECTRONICS AND 
GUIDED MISSILE FIELD 
No previous experience 

needed. Must be willing to 
spend one hour a day, four 
days a week, on short, prac­
tical industrial training using 
actual equipment under the 
guidance of our engineers. 
Arrangements will be made 
for those accepted so that 
training will not interfere 
with present employment. Po­
sitions for which this training 
will qualify you currently pay 
from $90 to $140 per week. 
If you have a sincere desire to 
better yourself with a steady 
job and income, we will be 
glad to discuss these oppor­
tunities with you. No ob­
ligation for strictly confiden­
tial interview with our bond­
ed personnel man.

Please write UNITED ELEC­
TRONICS LABORATORIES, 
Box 6, c /o  The Stratford Star, 
giving age, address, working 
hours at present; also phone 
number if you can be reach­
ed by phone.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Davis and 
her mother, Mrs. Jessie Wilson. 
They brought with them from 
Wichita, Kansas, a neighbor, 
Mrs. Grace McCormack to stay 
with Mrs. Wilson, who is in ill 
health.

Mrs. Zelda Dunlap spent last 
week end in Boise City with her 
son and daughter-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. Kay Dunlap.

Mrs. Ruby Neal returned home 
Tuesday morning from a visit 
in Denver, Colorado. Her 
daughter, Mrs. Joe Trimble and 
baby daughter, accompanied her 
home for a visit. , . ^

----------
Oma and Pete Ellison and 

Dick Diehl attended the Live­
stock Auction in Amarillo Mon­
day. _

John Trenfield, Follett, was a 
guest in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. W. L. Pendleton Saturday 
afternoon.

Mrs. R. A. Wilson, Dumas, was 
a guest in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. T. D. Chisum Friday.

M/Sgt. and Mrs. Elmer Pem­
berton and children left Mon­
day after visiting in the homes 
of Mrs. R. J. Davis, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Pemberton, Mr. and Mrs. 
H. A. Carter, and in the home 
of his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Pemberton of Amarillo. Sgt. 
Pemberton is stationed with the 
U. S. Air Force at Bangor, 
Maine.

Mrs. C. R. Foster visited her 
son, Newton Foster, in Dalhart 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. F. L. Yates and 
Miss Evelyn Cooper visited N. 
A. Kennedy in Clovis, New Mex­
ico Sunday. Mr. Kennedy, a 
brother of the late Mrs. H. J. 
Cooper, is recovering from an 
operation in Memorial Hospital 
at Clovis.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Taylor 
went to Pleasanton Thursday for 
a visit with Mrs. Taylor’s moth­
er, Mrs. W. H. Winn and other 
relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. C. Parrish of 
Pratt, Kansas were visitors in 
Stratford Monday.

Mrs. Blanche Strother, Mrs. I. 
D. Divine and Mrs. Dorothy R. 
Slay were among those attend­
ing the funeral of Roy Boney in 
Sunray Saturday.

Mrs. Arthur Ross and Mrs. Lor­
raine Mehner were visitors in 
Amarillo Saturday.

Mrs. Frank J. Patterson is vis­
iting her brother in Brownsville, 
and with friends in Edinburg.

Mrs. D. B. Kendall, Amarillo, 
visited relatives and friends in 
Stratford Thursday of last week.

CROSSWORD PUZZLE

ACROSS

Galway Bay 
t7 Province of 

India
18 The dill 18 Island Sast 

of Java to Letter of > alphabet SI Spanish 
artist

S3 Showered 
S5 Italian
S7 T l^ g  in law
28 Possess29 Strong desire SI Lighthearted 
85 Antic
88 Tarry40 Noise41 Directs
42 Alder trM 

(Scot.)
M Leaf of • fe n  
45 Pronoun 
48 To cut, after siUtdi 
42 Tutelary 

gods
48 One who sealously 

supports his 
country.n  A aeur^e-Us 
(her.)

82 Gold, in 
Spaiusb*

American countries 
53 Years old 
55 Golf score 

(pl.)59 Battle 62 Roster
64 College yell
65 Short for butter 

substitute
66 Pacific screw pine
68 Wireless
70 Map of 

town site
71 Level72 Uneven, as 

if eaten 
away

73 Makes lace

Geraint 
22 Sea eagle 
24 Beard of grain 
26 Viewed
30 Bitter vetch
31 Alcoholic drink32 Smell
33 Belonging 

to me34 Terminates
35 Snip36 Philippine dwarf 

negrito
37 Gone by
38 Desire
39 Form of 

"to be"
43 To soar 
43 Rough file

weed (pl.) 
DOWN

1 Depart
2 Alleviate* 
8 Item of

pro
4 Body water
8 Tree (pl.)6 Extra tir*
7 Female relative*
8 Anger 
• City ofMichigan

10 SmaU hoo**
11 JSgerlan 

seaport
12 Wan
12 Wife Of

46 Tranquillzes49 Mechanical 
man

50 Man’s name
51 French plural article
53 Am. officer in Revolu­

tionary War
54 Man of 

unusual size
56 Zeal

cove**
ing (pl.)59 Egyptian

60 Danish pot
61 Flesh
63 Allowance for waste
67 HaU69 Macaw
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Answer te Pvssle Me. 028

Sunray Saturday to attend the 
funeral of Roy Boney. Mrs. 
nores and Mrs. Kruse returned 
to Stratford with H. M. Flores 
and Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Flores, 
who also attended the funeral. 
Mrs, Kruse has been visiting in 
the home of Mrs. Flores this 
week.

W, J. Lowe left Saturday on a 
business trip to South Bend, In­
diana.

Mrs. Tim Flores went to Ama­
rillo Thursday of last 
week for a visit with 
her sister-in-law, Mrs. William 
Kruse of Lusk, Wyoming, in the 
home of Mr, and Mrs. George 
Cannon. Mrs. Cannon brought 
Mrs. Flores and Mrs. Kruse to

WE GIVE S&K GREEN STAMPS
Wednesday Is Double Stamp Day

P H O N E 4 8 5  1
WE SPECIALIZE IN

CAR W ASH IN G  and GREASING

Phillips 66 
Trop-Artie 

Oils
AND

Flight-Fuel

Midway
Service Station

JIM BLACK, Manager

Mrs. Johnnie Collins and 
children, Cathy and Mike, of 
Floydada, arrived Saturday for 
a visit with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lee Grimes.

Mr. and Mrs. Ross Turner vis­
ited in the home of his sister 
in Hugoton, Kansas Sunday.

Mrs. Allen Gibbons and little 
daughter. Sue, and Amaryllis 
Gibbons and Dick Bivins, all of 
Amarillo were week end guests 
in the Dick Diehl home. Mr. 
and Mrs. Diehl and Dick Jr. and 
their guests were visitors in

Dalhart Sfunday.

Mrs. H. M. Williams returned 
Monday from Chickasha, Okla­
homa, where she has been visit­
ing since she attended the fun­
eral of her sister there recently.

Among those attending the 
Knife and Fork Club meeting in 
Dalhart Saturday evening were 
Mr. and Mrs. W. O. Bryant, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. R. Pendleton, Mr. 
and Mrs. A. L. King, Mr. and 
Mrs. C. W. Moon, Mrs. Ruth 
Green and Mrs. Ruby Palmer.

Mr. and Mrs. F. L. Yates, Miss 
Evelyn Cooper and John Mc­
Daniel attended the band con­
cert in Texhoma Thursday 
night of last week.

Mrs. Zelda Dunlap went to 
Clovis, New Mexico Tuesday for 
a visit with her son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Art 
Outhier and son.

Mrs. Paul E. Smith and daugh­
ter and granddaughter, Mrs. Don

Warden and Gail, returned Mon­
day from a visit with a friend, 
Mrs. Corde Hollium in Garwood, 
Texas.

Miss Sharon Hampton, Mrs. 
Wayland Brown and Mrs. Russell

Albert were visitors in Amarillo 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Philip C. (John­
ny) Johnson and little daughter, 
Crissy, have moved from Lead- 
ville, Colorado, to Stratford to

make their home.

Among the earliest known uses 
of wood and iron rails on which 
to run wagons was in England be­
fo r e  1740, w here they w ere 
adapted to coal mines and slate 
quarries.

Buy Your

Motor Vehicle

License
L

BEFORE APRIL 1ST
Your License Plates may be put on at the time of pur­

chase. Farmers may register Truck-Tractors as Farm 
Trucks.

Cars with out-of-state license must have 1958 Texas tags 
before 1959 tags may he sold for the cars, if the cars are re­
gistered any time before April 1.

A ll vehicles must bear 1959 tags by midnight of April 
1, 1959.

To avoid delay and confusion bring your certificate of 
title and last year’s registration receipt.

Your County Tax Collector is Required under the Law 
to Examine the Title and License Receipt before he can 
renew the registration of your vehicle.

JohnKidwell
TAX ASSESSOR, SHERMAN COUNTY

STUDEBAKER PROUDLY WELCOMES
another distinguished name to its growing family of fine 
dCS-lcrS...' T. 0 . C. MOTOR CO. Highway 28?

now an authorized dealer for

by STUDEBAKER
YOUR NEW 

DIMENSION IN 
MOTORING

...TH E  STUDEBAKER SILVER HAWK 
and  a  fu ll  LINE OF STUDEBAKER TRUCKS

V̂ islt this new Studebaker showroom now and see the most rewarding automotive values o f  the day—-the 
great new line o f  cars and trucks that bear the oldest name in the industry. It’s the only full line o f  family 
cars, spc5rts cars and trucks specifically conceived to meet the needs and tastes o f  the times. Engineered and 
built by the famed craftsmen o f  Studebaker, these cars and trucks are uniquely designed for style with com ­
fort, peak performance with econom y, dependability with handling ease. See them now. You’ll be glad you did.
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Mrs. Keener 
Entertains 
Star HD Club

The Star Home Demonstration 
Club met Tuesday at 11:30 a. m.

in the home of Mrs. Raymond 
Keener for a covered dish 
luncheon.

Members present were Mes- 
dames Alfred Pronger, Roscoe 
Dyess, P. J. Pronger Jr., Arthur 
Judd, Leroy Judd and the hos­
tess, Mrs. Raymond Keener.

New members welcomed were 
Mrs. Ralph Keener, Mrs. Don­
ald Torrey and Mrs. Jimmie 
Milam.

The program on “Care of 
Lawns and Shrubs”, was given 
by Mrs. J. W. Smith.

The next meeting will be at

thsivhMbuijany
ELECTRIC
Clothes Dn|er!

W M U  Sponsors
Silver Tea And

%
Book Review

“Today’s a great day for me — friend husband earned a day off from work
and volimteered to do the wash for me. I see him now lugging a heavy'basket of wet clothes
out to line — watch his fingers turn blue as that icy wind bitterly blows,..
whoops.. .  he just dropped a shirt, and it’s a mess. (I can’t tell what he’s saying, but
I’ll bet he’s thinking about an electric clothes dryer) and I think I’ll be
ready for him — I’ll call the Reddy Kilowatt dealer right now about models and prices.
Everybody teUs me there’s one to fit any budget. Say, here’s an idea —
if you don’t have an electric clothes dryer then get your husband to hang out the
wash -!■ just once is all it’ll take.”

The Baptist W.M.U. sponsored 
a Silver Tea and Book Review 
in Fellowship Hall Wednesday, 
February 25, at 2:30 p. m.

Mrs. Arlyn Haile, Mission 
Study Chairman, welcomed ev­
eryone and explained the tea 
was to increase interest in the 
new church library. Mrs. T. 
F. Baskin, chairman of the Li­
brary Committee, told the la­
dies about some of the books in 
the library and explained the 
greatest need is children’s books, 
especially for ages 9 to 11. Mrs. 
Baskin introduced the guest 
speaker, Mrs. Ben Biddy, who 
reviewed the book “Your Pray­
ers Are Always Answered” by 
Alexander Lake. Then the guests 
were served tea and dainty 
sandwiches by Mrs. Emmett Mc- 
Bryde. The table carried out 
the W.M.U. color scheme of pur­
ple and white, with a lace cloth 
over purple and a centerpiece of 
purple and white astors.

Guests were: Mrs. O. L. Mc- 
Minn, Mrs. P. J. Pronger Jr., 
Mrs. M. L. Mitts, Mrs. C. C. 
Plunk, Mrs. Chester Guthrie, 
Mrs, H. Beauchamp, Mrs. W. O 
Cook, Mrs, A. H. Ellison, Mrs. 
W. D. Ellis, Mrs. P. O. Adkins, 
Mrs. H. T. Galloway, Mrs. M. E. 
Upchurch, Mrs. Joe Brown, Mrs. 
W, P. Brooks, Mrs. Howard Haf- 
fey, Mrs. Willard Scarth, Mrs. J. 
S. Johnson, Mrs. H. B. Norris, 
Mrs. W, E. Pleyer, Mrs, Elma 
McDaniel, Mrs. Jim Taylor, Mrs. 
K. Kendrick, Mrs. Dorothy Slay, 
Mrs. V. M. King, Mrs. Leon 
Guthrie, Mrs. Doyle Roberson, 
Mrs. Rex Christian, Mrs, Zelda 
Dunlap, Mrs. Ross Turner, Mrs. 
A. V.  Pittman and Mrs. John 
Lavake.

K E G O O P BRU$H66 
... ANP ME WAG f e a t u r in g - 
A  5 P E C IA L OFPar^ TH IG  

_  WEEK.,.

'& / r c e r * ^  FACE

COULP K IC K  M Y S E LF  FOR 
LETTlNGrTHE HANP50ME 

V PEVjL CHARM ME: INTO 
f  b u y in g TMIE JUNK]

V -  ^

SEE YOUR 
R m O Y KILOW ATT

S liE C T R I C
APPLIANCE

SOUTHWESTERN

| t t * i  ., UVE BETTER̂ • PUBLIC SERVICE
C O M PA N V'

Mrs. Cummings 
W ill Entertain 
Embroidery Club

The Embroidery Club will meet 
in the home of Mrs. W. P, Cum­
mings Thursday, March 12, at 
2:30.

11:30 a. m. Tuesday, March 17, 
in the home of Mrs. Roscoe Dyess 
for a covered dish luncheon. 
The program will be on “Tile- 
craft”.

Mrs. Lowe 
Entertains 
Jolly Neighbors

The Jolly Neighbors Home 
Demonstration Club met Thurs­
day, February 26, in the home of 
Mrs. Joyce Lowe.

Plans Were made for a family 
party on April 7, at the County 
Exhibit Building. The film, “A 
Tenderfoot in Europe”, will be 
shown.

The county committee recom­
mendations were read and voted 
on. Mrs. Willard Scarth gave 
a demonstration on “Hanging 
Pictures in the Home”,

Mrs. Lowe served refreshments 
to guests, Mrs. Bill Crabtree 
and Mrs. Stipe, and to club 
members, Mrs. Walter Lasley, 
Mrs. Jim Wood, Mrs. Rex Chris­
tian, Mrs. Bill Lasley, Mrs. Wil­
lard Scarth and Mrs. Lorel 
Haile.

CARD OF THANKS
I want to thank every one for 

being so nice to me while I was 
in the hospital and since I re­
turned home,

Mrs. Earl C. Garoutte

TRIM  FORM CO.
OF DUMAS

FREE DEMONSTRATIONS 
CaU W£ 5-2581 C«^ect

O fficia l Tests Prove

o u r POWERS THEM ALL !

f " -vm "

Prove on your own farm what 
nationally recognized tests 
proved. Taking on aU comers 
in  its  cla ss , the n ew  s ix - 
cylinder Farmall 560 outpow- 
ered them all in belt and 
drawbar horsepower. And, 
added to this new world of 
power, the Fanhall 560 main­
tained the traditional IH fuel 
econom y. Come in today. 
We’U give you exact test fig­
ures on this new champion. 
Let us bring the Farmall 560 
proof to your farm.

Sets New
Record Of.**
• 65.2 belt 

horsepower

• 59.4 drawbar 
horsepower

• Low per-acre 
fuel cost

Try the world's most powerful, 
row crop tractor. *  *  Call TODAY!

K I N G
E Q U I P M E N T  C O .

IFOIRID is built for people...

is built for savings!
Fords are lowest priced of the most popular 
three! Equipped with radio, heater, and 
automatic transmission— Fords are priced 
up to $102.75 less!

Ford Six and standard Thunderbird V-8 
engines thrive on lower-cost regular gas s s a 
save you up to a dollar a tankful. Ford’s 
standard Full-Flow Oil Filter saves still more . ;  a 
you go a full 4000 miles between oil changes.

New, standard aluminized Ford mufflers 
normally last twice as long as the 
ordinary kind. And Ford’s exclusive new 
Diamond Lustre Finish never needs waxing.

for a better buy ia a used 
ear or truck, be sure to see 
•Of

) world’s best-selling cars...
W O M B ’S M OST BEAM UmiLLY PR O PO im O N ED  CAIRS

Stratford Motor Co., Inc.
STRATFORD, TEXAS

J U S T  E X A C T L Y

What Is A Bank?

a

A  Bank is technically a repository for 
money. It is a chartered and incorpor­
ated institution established to receive 
and safeguard money —  to invest that 
money —  and to act as an agent in the 
transfer of funds from one source to an­
other.

It is, in a sense, hot unlike a department store. But 
instead of dealing in commodities, a bank deals in money.

To facilitate its money transactions, your bank di­
vides its services into departments — with each depart­
ment responsible for a specific kind of financial transac­
tion.

Your bank has many such departments, falling into 
general categories of checking accounts, loans, and special­
ized departments which offer such serviees as money or­
ders, travelers checks, drafts and safe deposit boxes.

WHAT IS A BANK?
To a community, it’s a partner in pro­

gress and stability; to business it’s a 
partner in growth and expansion; and to 
a housewife, it’s a partner in conven­
ience and money management.

Your own definition of a bank de­
pends, we suggest, upon how you use 
your bank. But whatever your defini­
tion —  you can look upon your bank 
primarily as a good friend.

The First State Bank
O F  S T R A T F O R D

Your Deposits Insured Up To $10,000 By Federal Deposit
Insurance Corporation
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Give Birthday 
Dinner For 
Mrs. J. L. Turner

Mrs. J. L. Turner was honored 
with a birthday dinner in her 
home Sunday which was prepar­
ed and brought in by her child­
ren. Those enjoying the occa- 
tion were: Mr. and Mrs. J. L.

Turner, Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Boothby and Rusty Turner of 
Texhoma, Mr. and Mrs. Everett 
Toomey and son of Sunray, Mrs. 
Virginia Kimbrell and children 
of Sunray, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Keener and children.

There are more than 1,100 
credit unions in Texas with ov­
er 600,000 members.

See Boston’s
FOR t h e ; b e s t  d e a l  in

RCA Whirlpool
. .  A P P L I A N C E S  * .

. . .  W E L C O M E  T O
C O T  N E Y
Chevron Service

Under the Management O f 
Darrell Cotney

LET US PUT “ SPRING”  
IN YOUR CAR

* Get rid of oil and dirt accumulation.
* Get rid of dirty sludge in your crank case.
* Get a' complete new WASH and POLISH JOB.
*  GET A  COMPLETE

Chevron Spring Lubrication

Cotney Chevron Station
Darrell Cotney, Manager 

Phone ---------- 3381

Young People A t 
Youth Conference

Gradene Parvin, Sharon Mul- 
lican, Ann Burgess, Bobbie Bur­
gess, Sharon Gamble, Mark 
Gates and Tony Laird attended 
the Methodist Youth Vocational 
Conference held at St. John’s 
Church in Lubbock Saturday and 
Sunday. They were accompan­
ied to Lubbock by Mrs. C. C. 
Plunk and sons, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bob Burgess and Mrs. Charles 
Gates.

Church of Christ
(Vernon Williams, Minister)

Sunday Services 
Bible Study 10:00 a. m. 
Worship 10:55 a. m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p. m. 

Tuesday ,
Ladies class 9:30 a. m. 

Wednesday 
Bible study 7:00 p. m.
A friendly welcome awaits you 

at all services.

Catholic Chapel
(Rev. James W. Sonderman, Mis­
sion Pastor, Phone Dalhart 235)
Sundays

Confession 8:15 a. m. 
Catechism 8:15 a. m.
Mass 9:00 a. m.

THE BAFFLES By Mahoney

JlM€LEALl.n r

Methodist Church
(Rev. Charles R. Gates, Pastor)

Sunday School 9:45 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m. 
M. Y. F. 6:00 p. m. 
Intermediate Fellowship 6:00 

p. m.
Junior additional session 6:00 

p. m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p. m. 
Wesleyan Guild meets second 

Wednesday of each month at 
7:30 p. m.

W. S. C. S. Circles meet Wed­
nesdays.

Official Board meeting second 
Tuesday of each month.

Want Ads
Announcements

STRATFORD LODGE 874 
Russell Beall, W.M.
F. B. Mullins, Secy. 

STATED COMMUNICATION
Third Thursday Every Month 

7:00 P. M.
I Will NOT be responsible 

for any bills contracted after 
F e b r u a r y  10,  by any­
one other than myself against 
the Fifty-Four Cafe. — Mrs. 
Luicy Kelp. 10-4tp

Special Services
WILL DO IRONING in my 

home, Mrs. Norvell Blake, 4 
blocks south on Gruver High­
way. 9-3tp

Complete John Deere Diesel 
Service and Dynamometer pow­
er tested tune-ups — Sherman 
Implement Co. 5-tfc

FOR Prompt TV and Radio 
Service, Call 4671.— Peterson’s 
TV and Radio Shop, Roy and 
Mike Peterson. 36-tfc

For Sale

FOR SALE or RENT: Three 
bedroom unfurnished house, 
corner of North Third and 
Spruce, Stratford, call collect 
Dumas 5-2989, J. R. Purgason, 
M. D. 42-tfc

FOR SALE: 1957 Ford Pickup, 
good as new. — Earl C. Garoutte.

10-2tc
HAY, Prairie and Alfalfa. See 

J. I. Mooney at Garrison Motor 
Co. 3-tfc

FOR SALE: John Deere Trac­
tor, 1949‘model D; 2 Wheat 
Drills; 4 section harrow. — Mrs. 
Ruby Palmer, Phone 3051. 6-tfc

BABY CHICKS in all popular 
ireeds, laying and broiler 
;trains. All kinds of chick and 
Loultry supplies. — Dalhart 
Hatchery, Box 427, Phone 71, 
Dalhart, Texas. 6-tfc

FOR SALE: 12 cubic foot May­
tag upright freezer, practically 
new. — Earl C. Garoutte. 10-2tc

FOR SALE: 7.9 Horse Power 
Champion outboard motor $85.— 
McMahen Furniture Co. 8-tfc

Assembly Of God 
Church

(Rev. J. O. Brown. Pastor)
Sunday School 10:00 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m. 
Young People 6:00 p. m. 
Children’s Church 6:00 p. m. 
Evangelistic Service 7:00 p. 

m.
Wednesday night"service 8.00 

p. m.
The public is invited to all 

services.

FIRST

Christian Church
(B. R. Clark, Minister)

Sunday School 9:45 a. m. 
Morning worship 10:45 a. m. 
Youth groups 6:00 p. m. 

Evening Worship 7:00 p. m. 
Mid-week Bible Study and 

prayer 7:00 p. m.
A friendly welcome awaits 

you at any service of the First 
Christian Church.

TELEVISION, Radio and Elec­
trical Appliance Repair Service. 
Have complete stock of repair 
parts. — Signal Service, Frank 
Baber, manager, Phone 5491 day 
or night. 38-tfc

Travelers Insurance Co. loans 
made on Real Estate fOr drilling 
Irrigation wells or for refinanc­
ing. — Minnie Laura Jackson.

8-tfc
I will continue writing State 

Farm Insurance although I am 
forking at the Sherman County 
Abstract Co. — Mrs. R. B. Ter­
rell. 30-tfc

CALL 5031 for pies, cookies, 
cakes, rolls or any kind of pas­
tries, very reasonable. — Mar­
garet Harrington. 10-tfc

For Rent
FOR RENT: Three room House 

with shower and tub bath in 
South Stratford, furnished or 
unfurnished, price reduced. — 
Sam Cunningham. 10-tfc

USED HAMMOND Chord Or 
gan: Excellent condition, fully 
guaranteed, only $695.00. For 
information either write or call 
collect, Clark Music Co., 409 N. 
8th St., Garden City, Kansas. 
Phone Bridge 6-7362. Terms up 
to 36 nibnths. 8-3tc

Beautifully Baldwin Acrosonic 
Piano, just returned from ren­
tal, make a substantial savings 
by purchasing before instrument 
is returned to store. For infor­
mation write or call collect, 
Clark Music Co., 409 N. 8th St., 
Garden City, Kansas. Phone 
Bridge 6-7362. Terms up to 36 
months. 8-3tc

LIFE INSURANCE: Get the 
policy to fit your needs to do 
what you want it to do. See Ira 
D. Divine, life insurance agent 
for Farm Bureau Insurance 
Companies. Notary Public in 
Office. 8-tfc

Wanted
Douglas, Bingham & Johnson 

Land Company wants listings 
for land in Sherman County. 
Write Paul D. Johnson, Overton 
Building, North Dumas Ave., P. 
O. Box 391, Dumas, Texas, or 
Phone WE 5-5239, Dumas. 3-12tc

Baptist Church
(M. E. Upchurch, Pastor)

Sunday School 10:00 a. m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a. m. 
Training Union 6:30 p. m. 
Evening Worship 7:30 p. m. 
Mid-week prayer service 7:00 

p. m. Wednesday.

LOCAL MAN OR WOMAN 
NEEDED

To service and collect from 
automatic merchandise units. 
Excellent opportimity for quali­
fied person. Must be free to 
work 8 or 9 hours weekly, have a 
car and $398.00 to $795.00 work­
ing capital. Submit work his­
tory and phone number. For in­
terview write National Sales & 
Mfg. Co., Inc., Dept. G., 3508 
Greenville Ave., Dallas 6, Texas.

OPPOR’TUNITY AVAILABLE 
For Qualified Man or Woman
To service and collect from 

cigarette machines in this area. 
Part or full time. Excellent op­
portunity for qualified person. 
$592.50 to $1,975.00 cash required 
to enable you to begin imme­
diately. Company finances ex­
pansion. If you have serviceable 
cp,r and 8 spare hours weekly 
write, giving particulars to Na­
tional Mfg. & Distributing Com­
pany, 5646 Milton, Dallas 6, Tex­
as.

New Arrivals
Mr. and Mrs. John L. Cearley 

of Cactus are the parents of a 
four pound two and one-half 
ounce son, John Charles, born at 
7:30 a. m. Sunday in Dumas 
Memorial Hospital. The pre­
mature child is reported to be 
doing nicely in an incubator. 
Maternal grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. George Skillin of Strat­
ford. Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Cear­
ley of Kaw, Oklahoma are the 
paternal grandparents.

Among the Sick
Mrs. David Johnson was re­

leased from Northwest Texas 
Hospital in Amarillo Thursday 
of last week.

of Mr. and Mrs. L. M. Worley. 
Young Worley strained his back 
in Guymon last week while mov­
ing a carcus of beef in a butcher 
shop where he is employed.

One year from today there will 
be 36.5 million more people in 
the world.

Ralph Hampton underwent 
surgery in Dumas Memorial 
Hospital Thursday of last week.

John McDaniel was brought 
home from an Amarillo hospital 
Tuesday of last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Burgess 
announce the arrival of twin 
granddaughters, whose parents 
are Mr. and Mrs. James Gam­
brel of Ordway, Colorado. The 
twins were born February 13 in 
a Rocky Ford, Colorado Hospit­
al. They are Sherri Lou, who 
weighed 7 pounds 4i/̂  ounces, 
and Terri Sue, who weighed 7 
pounds 1% ounces. The pater­
nal grandmother is Mrs. Lloyd 
Gambrel of Roy, New Mexico. 
Mr. and Mrs. H. Beauchamp of 
Stratford are maternal great 
grandparents. Mrs. Burgess, 
who had been in Ordway with 
her daughter and family return­
ed home Sunday with Mr. Bur­
gess, who also visited there last 
week end.

Mrs. L. B. Haile was taken to 
Dumas Memorial Hospital Sat­
urday for further medical care. 
She recently underwent a ma­
jor operation.

Mrs. W. D. Brannan is report­
ed to be in an improved condi­
tion in Northwest Texas Hospital 
in Amarillo where she has been 
hospitalized for observation and 
treatment.

Mrs. T. P. Oquin was brought 
home Friday from Dumas, where 
she has been ill in the home of 
her son and daughter-in-law, 
Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Oquin.

IT*S EASY KEEPING 
THIS LITTLE BUNDLE' 
OF JOY CONTENTED/
I GET AU HIS BABY 
NECOS P B P M -r-

RUG
2291

THEIR co u r teo u s ;  
FRIENDLY SERVICE 
MAKES IT A PLEASURE 

Tp DEAL THERE /

It Pays — To Read Star Ads

jjr'"

LAM AR
DENVER

7:56 A. M., 1:56 A. M. 
, 3:21 P. M.

AM ARILLO
DALLAS

1:51 A. M„ 8:19 A. M. 
7:10 P. M.

T R J U L W A Y S
Highway 287 Phone 4771

John Worley, Guymon, was 
moved to Dumas Memorial Hos­
pital Saturday for the treatment 
of a back injury. He is the son

Prepare For Cold Weather With A

Willard Battery
Priced from $9>95 up

M U F F L E R S
GUARANTEED FOR THE LIFE OF THE CAR

Gulf Super Service

Impala Sport Coupe— like every Chevy— has Safety Plate Glass all around.

Chevy stops quickest... goes farthest on a gallon 1f
Chevy showed the best brakes of the 
leading low-priced three in a test of 
repeated stops at highway speeds con­
ducted and certified by NASCAR*. 
Chevy also won over the other two in 
a NASCAR economy run—with the 
highest gas mileage for 6’s and V8’s at 
cruising speeds of just over 55 miles 
an hour.

Here’s a car that knows howto get 
the most out of a gallon. And it’s the 
only car in its field to bring you 
hydraulic valve lifters in all popular 
engines—6 and V8. This means 
smoother, quieter performance for you.
There are many other advances just 
as fundamental as the efficiency of 
Chevrolet’s engines and the depend­

ability of its new brakes (with more lin­
ing area than any other low-priced car). 
But why not stop by your dealer’s and 
let Chevy do its own sweet talking!

*National Association for Stock Car Advancement 
and Research.

see your local authorized Chevrolet* dealer for quick appraisal— early delivery!

Davis Motor Co.
NORTH SECOND AND MAIN STRA'TFORD, TEXAS PHONE 3191
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Homer Boren 
In Warfare 
fciercise

SAN DIEGO — Homer W. 
Horen, aviation electronics tech­
nician second class, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Allen Boren of Her­
rick, took part in an anti-sub­
marine warfare exercise Peb. 
16-19 off the coast of Southern 
California. He is attached to 
Air Anti-Submarine Squadron 
38.

“Sk3met”, formed of vessels of 
the TT.S. First Fleet and several 
units of the Haval Reserve took 
part in the exercise under the
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operational control of Vice Ad­
miral R. E. Libby, commander of 
the First Fleet.

Legisiation In—
(Contiued from Page 1)

statutes to allow vehicles parked 
on roadways and shoulders to 
use either amber or white park­
ing lights. Present regulations 
allow only white parking lights 
for the front.

HB 3, 33, 60 and 173 are being 
scrutinized very carefully and 
given extra researrih and atten­
tion by Mr. Buchanan as he has 
received correspondence from 
you showing your concern. 
Should you desire, 13ie next news 
report could give more coverage

Dr« Guy D. Clctyton 
OPTOMETRIST

BOimS: 900 to 12:00 ------ 1:30 to 'OrOO
SATURDAYS 9:00 to 12:90 

“BY APPOINIMENT ONLY” 
iSSONE--------- CH9-28M

304 Denrock Pa&art

Stratford Abstract Co.
Minxiie Laiira Jackson, Pirestdeni

inoofporated 1907 — M years of SatMaoloxy Service 
to Sheiman Ooonty Land Owners

Let Us Make Y<»ir Abstracts
WE SHOW TBE RBCORiDS

OPTiCE ABBQRfC]  ̂ l^GiON BUILDING

O v e n

F r e A

Home
Baked

Tasty Pastries
FRESH FROM OUR OVEN S

Palace Citfe

ABSTRACTS
W E H A V E  A  COMPLETE  

AB STR AC T PLANT

Covering A ll Real Estate In 
Sherman County

W e Furnish Quick Efficient Service 
On Short Notice

Sherman County Abstract Co.
4̂41!.

WE’RE IN BUSINESS TO
Right Car “Wrongs”

Car performance not up to par? Better let us take 
a look-see. Possibly what’s needed is an expert adjust­
ment and synchronization of ignition, carburetion and 
electrical system. Maybe it’s something else. Whatever’s 
wrong------we’ll make BIGHT!

Our Customers Drive O ff With 
Confidence

It’s a wonderful feeling to take the wheel of your car, 
after repairs, and drive off with full confidence that every­
thing has been taken care of expertly, “thoroughly.”  Our 
skill and “know how” give you this satisfying assurance. 
Try us, next time!

Phillips 66
OILS, GREASES 

and
Gasolines

T.O.C. Motor Co.
Studebaker Cars and Trucks

L A F F  O F  T H E  W E E K Roy Boney 
Funeral In 
Sunray
^Funeral services for Boy Bon­

ey, 75 year old former mayor 
long-time resident of Sunray, 
were conducted Saturday after­
noon at the Sunray First Bap­
tist Church. Rev. M. G. Upton, 
pastor, was assisted by Rev. Cur­
tis Lee, pastor of the First Meth­
odist Church, in conducting the 
service. Burial was made in 
Lane Memorial Cemetery.

Sunray’s Masonic Lodge No. 
1281 conducted graveside rites.

Mr. Boney had lived in Moore 
County for 51 years. He was a 
retired farmer and rancher. 
Death came at 12:20 Friday in 
Dumas Memorial Hospital where 
he had been a patient for about 
two weeks. He was born in Bell 
County, Texas on August 5, 1883.

Pallbearers were Sid Park, J. 
R. Morris, Lester Wells, Sam

Cluck, Luther Browder and 
Barney Lanners.

Survivors include his wife, 
Carrie; two sons, T. J., of Ord- 
way, Colorado and John of Gru- 
ver; a daughter, Mrs. Lucille 
Ferguson of Happy; three bro­
thers, L. O. Boney of Morse, G. 
C. Boney of Amarillo, and R. H. 
Boney of Anaheim, California;

two sisters, Mrs. V. M. King of 
Stratford and Mrs. W. P. Wil­
liams of Dallas; four grand­
children and two great grand­
children.

Tutankhaumun’s tomb, discov­
ered in 1922. is the only unplun­
dered sepulcher of an Egyptian 
I^araoh yet found.

WE WERE.  G L A D
To Have You Attend Our Formal 

Opening of the

E-Z AUTOMATIC LAUNDRY
•  16 New Automatic Washers
•  4 Large 40 Lb. Capacity Dryers
•  1 Starch Sink
CONVENIENTLY ARRANGED FOR YOUR USE 24 HOURS

A DAY

E-Z AUTOMATIC LAUNDRY
Mr. and Mrs. Ri&sell Beall

"Show me something fhst wfO go with purple jowls and 
«  ved nose witb little bine veins to it,** ,

and breakdown on these bills. 
There -has been a considerable 
amoimt of correspondence both 
pro and con and both sides could 
be presented.

JLs ia jresult of a ,poU of people 
in District 95, Mr. Buchanan has 
joined Representative Richard 
C. Slack of District 104 in intro- 
during HB 498 which will pro­
vide for uniform regulation of 
the hunting of antelope by the 
Game and Fish Commission 

^rntber fhan appnive a, bill which 
would allow the regulation to be 
done differently in each locality, 
and differ from locality to local- 
ity-

laie purpose of this report is 
to keep the people of the 95th 
District informed as to the man­
ner in which they are represent­
ed. The subjects ^discussed will 
be those chosen by the people. 
Ehch issue discussed will tre de­
termined in the future from mail 
received by Mr. Buchanan which 
advocates or opposes the legis­
lation introduced in the Texas 
L^gisMture. Whether contro­
versial or non-controversial 
bills are discussed will depend 
entirely on which has the most 
interest to the people.

Cliildren Take 
School Work 
To Study Hall

When a fourth grader at the 
Juliette Fowler Children’s 
Home in Dallas is stumped by 
an arithmetic problem in his 
home work, he can call for help.

Mrs. Martha Harrison, former­
ly of Stratford, study hall sup­
ervisor, performs that parental 
study.

When the youngest children 
come home from school at 2:30 
p. m., they troop immediately to 
the study hall.

They are joined later by older 
children with tougher prob­
lems.

Mrs. Harrison frequently tu­
tors young students until 9:00 
p. m.

Fifteen years as a public 
school teacher in Stratford pre­
pared her for the job.

She joined the staff of the 
Juliette Fowler Home in Dallas 
in September of 1958. ' •

A picture of Mrs. Harrison 
and five young students in the 
home appeared in the February 
issue of The Christian Courier.

THANK YOU
We wish to thank those who 

helped with the Heart Fund 
Drive on Heart Sunday and those 
who made contributions. We
want to especially thank the
grade school children who gave 
$79.00. If we missed you on 
Heart Sunday and you wish to 
give something you may hand it 
to O. H. Oquin at The First State 
Bank.

J. W. Flores, Chairman

THANK YOU
I wish to thank each one who 

visited me; also for the beautiful 
flowers, other gifts and many 
cards I received while I was in 
Dumas Memorial Hospital. May 
God’s richest blessings be on 
each of you.

Sincerely,
Mrs. L. B. HaUe

NOTICE OF SALE OF - 
SMITH CHEVRON STATION

I have sold the Smith Chevron 
Station to Darrell Cotney. All 
those having accounts with the 
firm previous to March 1, are 
requested to make prompt settle­
ment, and those having accounts 
against the firm are requested to 
present them for payment.

Your cooperation in prompt 
settlement of all accounts will 
be appreciated, so that the books 
of the firm may be closed as soon 
as possible. This will enable me 
to bbznply with the Bulk Sales 
Law in substantiating to the new 
owner that the property is free 
and clear of any liens, mort­
gages, debts, or other encum­
brances of whatsoever kind or 
nature.

EDWARD H. SMITH
10-2tc.

Every ten days the world’s 
population increases by erne :mil- 
lion people.

T H A N K S
W e wish to express our appreciation to the people of this 

territory for the patronage we have enjoyed during the past 
5^ years we have operated the Smith Chevron Station.

W e closed our books on March 1 to transfer the business 
to a new owner whom we feel sure will serve you in a satis­
factory manner.

W e plan to continue making Stratford our home, and in 
the near future we hope to devote our time to serving you 
with the Sales and Service of Case Farm Machinery.

Mr. and Mrs. Edward H. Smith
. ,'s ^ ' r >

STYLE

Ffom new r e a r 9 e d (  
io ltandsome,gi;î ,

imoetem food 
taste speaks to  iitseif. 
fto erfremes in styling here 
—this is ̂ wogressiMB 
stylî atihlresK!

Compare! Pl'yflaauth givesy«su so many more features, so much more value for your new-car dollar. 
Itad, ttenks to Plymouth’sniany economy features for '59, you’ll save money every mile you drive!

• b ig !
' DIFFEREMCE 

JN
FEATURES

PLYMOUTH , CAR
“C”

CAReipw PLYMOUTH CAR
“C”

CARi<pn
Torsloa-har fnmt sus|̂ si0n V ' OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT
Total-Contact fif̂ es V  1 Swivel Seats V
Electic windshield wipers V V  I Rear Sport Deck styling V
Most driver headroom V Push-Button transmission V
Most driver iegreom V Push-Button heating V
Greatest trunk capacity V Mirror-Matic rear-view mirror V
Long-iife baked enamel V V Biggest engine V

BIG
DIFFERENCE IN 

RIDE AND 
PERFORMANCE

AND PLYMOUTH’S “TWO-MILE TRY-OUT” PROVES IT!
Tw o miles at the wheel, and you’ll agree no other car in Plymouth’s field can match 
the smoothness of Plymouth’s no-extra-cost Torsion-Aire Ride. And you’ll enjoy a 
inew feeling of command when you boss the biggest V-8 in Plymouth’s field— the 
(fiptional New Golden Commando 395.

BUT...Y0U DON’T PAY FOR THE DIFFERENCE!
That’ s because all three top-selling low-price cars are priced within a few dollars of each other. 
They all cost about the same, but only Plymouth gives you the Big Difference for your money. 
See your Plymouth dealer for the facts and figures . . .  and ask for that “ Two-Mile Try-Out”  todayl

6o much the same in price,••to different on the road.
€  Todav's bast tuv. .. hToday» bast buy..,tftfoorrbw*s bast trada
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Dord Fitz 
To Address 
Study Club

Dord Fitz, director of the Dord 
Fitz School of Art and the Dord 
Fitz Galleries in Amarillo, will 
be the main speaker at the 
meeting of the Prospectus-Study 
Club to be held Friday in the 
home of Mrs. B. L. (Chuck) 
Smith.

The ladies will meet as a group 
in front of the First Methodist 
Church at 9:30 a. m. Friday, 
and drive to the country home 
of Mrs. B. L. Smith where Mrs. 
Arthur Lee Ross will assist with 
the entertaining as co-hostess.

Mrs. Kenneth Kendrick will 
present the program. Dord Fitz 
will speak on the relationship of 
modern day art to every day 
life. Mrs. .L. J. Davis wgl play 
the “Lord’s Prayer’” as a piano 
selection.

Art and music as' a hobby is 
the subject for the program. 
Learn something beautiful, see 
something beautiful, do some­
thing beautiful each day of your 
life, is the theme of the study.

Dord Fitz received his mas­
ter’s degree from the University 
of Iowa, his BA degree was se­
cured from Kentucky Eastern 
State, and he studied at the 
Chicago Art Institute. Fitiz 
studied under the famous ar­
tists Jan Chariot, Fletcher Mar­
tin and Grant Wood before serv-. 
ing 14 years as the professor in 
charge of art at the Unversity 
o f Kentucky. He has portrait 
paintings hanging in 28 states, 
and serves as art director of the 
Tri-State Fair. Dord Fitz is 
the art instructor of the Tri- 
Corner Art Club in Stratford.

The Stratford Star
Published Weekly By 

Brown Ross
Entered as second class matter 

at the Post Office in Stratford, 
Texas, under the act of March 
8, 1879.

Subscription Rates 
$3.00 per year in Sherman and 

adjoining counties. $3.50 per 
year outside first zone.

Classified and Legals 
3 cents per word 'first inser­

tion, 50c minimum, 2 cents per 
word subsequent insertions. 
Display rates on application.

A U C T I O N
S A L E

Every Sunday
2:00 P. M.

WE SPECIALIZE IN 
NEW MERCHANDISE

Dumas Auction
D U M A S

Elaine Cummings 
To Appear On 
Talent Show

Elaine Cummings, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Cummings, 
will appear as a contestant on 
the KGNC talent show from 4:30 
to 5:30 p. m. Saturday. She is 
being sponsored by Bill’s Food 
Service and popularity votes 
may be cast by writing to Ama­
rillo or phoning Bill Frizzell.

In the period between 1700 and 
1825 snuff was used alm ost to 
the man in both Exurope and 
Am erica, ‘Hie era has been called 
“ Tbe Great Snuff Age.**

Practice 
For Easter 
Cantata

Members of the choirs of the 
churches of  ̂ Stratford have 
started practice* for the presen­
tation of the annual Easter Can­
tata. Practices” are being held 
in the First Christian'Church at 
8:00 p. m. on Wednesday. All 
singers interested in taking part 
in the annual event are invited 
to attend the practices of the 
combined choirs. Joe Mack Hill 
is conducting the cantata which 
will probably be presented in the 
First Christian Church on Palm 
Sunday.

BEYOND THE STARS . . .  A worker checks the finished product— 
a flag— b̂ehind a silk screen used to print the new 49-star field on 
U. S. Flags.

TRY OUT 
& SEE ABOUT

’“l A R K "
bystudebakeb

OODLES OF OOMPH 
ON A HATFUL OF GAS

—regular, low-cost economy gas! A mere sprinkling of it takes 
The Lark for miles and miles with peak performance, whether you drive 
the spirited six or the super-responsive V-8. And you drive it so easily,
park it so tidily, turn it so neatly—because it’s a sensible three feet shorter 
outside than conventional cars. (But plenty of room inside for six.) : > ■  
And with all its economy (cuts insurance, repair and maintenance costs), 
it’s so richly, rightly styled, it’s fashion approved by Harper’s Bazaar.
And beautifully engineered. This is common sense on wheels, folks—and 
about time you tried it. You can—today. Do itl

Automatic Transmissioni 
available on all models

Fun drive the LARK today at

T. 0 . C. Motor Co. 2nd & Poplar Stratford, Tex.

«4 2 » Tournament 
A t Spurlock 
Friday Night

A ♦“42” tournament and auc­
tion sale will be held in the 
basement of the Spurlock Chapel 
Friday night. The entertain­
ment will begin at 7:30 p. m. and 
is being sponsored by the South- 
side Home Demonstration Club. 
The public is invited to attend. 
Refreshments of home-made pie 
and coffee will be served.

Ma th em at i ca l  problems in­
scribed on clay tablets found near 
Baghdad, Iraq, indicate that 
schoolboys were learning about 
the hypotenuse of a right triangle 
1,700 years before Euclid’s time

Red Cross 
Drive Will 
Open Monday

The annual Sherman County 
Red Cross drive will be opened 
Monday in an attempt to raise a 
quota of $748.00, according to V. 
W. Foreman, county campaign 
chairman.

Ladies of the Nu Beta and Xi 
Elpsilon Iota chapters of the 
Beta Sigma Phi will conduct a 
house to house canvass of Strat­
ford. They plan to start their 
calls in the residential section 
at 6:00 p. m. Monday. Consid­
erable time may be saved if resi­

dents of the city will have their 
contributions ready when the 
sorority ladies call at their 
doors.

Chester Guthrie, long time 
Red Cross contact man in the 
business district, will accept con­
tributions from business and 
professional men and women

again this year.
Leon Guthrie is county Red

Cross chairman and Mrs. Ray
McNeal is secretary-treasurer of 
the organization.

The average savings per mem­
ber in the credit unions of the 
U.S. last year was $353.88.

N O T I C E
I Have Moved the Signal Service Shop 

to 604 Pearl Street 
P H O N E ------5 4 9 1

Frank Baber

Buy The Best For Less
Fryers
Swift Premium Grade A
FRESH DRE.SSED POUND

E g g s  2 0
Guaranteed Grade A
DOZEN ^

P O R K  C H O P S  J A  
Corn Fed ' ̂
Lean —  Pound M

BREADED SHRIMP1 Booth —  Large Colossal ■ B
\ 2 lb. box mm

BE E F  R O A S T  A Q
U.S.D.A. GOOD
CHUCK Pound

\ S N O W D R I F T

S H O R T E N I N G  R C k
3 Pound Tin

S T E A K
r.S.D.A. GOOD A  R ̂  W
CLUB Pound

S A L M O N  /A F t
H O N EY BO Y TM’t-F
TALL TIN

B A C O N  A /t
CORN KING rreJ
POUND

Mellorine ) f |
1/2 Gallon J #  
P E A C H E S  pg
HUNT’S Rfl K
No. T in ------29< IK
§ cans for

T U N A  - t n
HI-NOTE •

Coffee
F O L G E R S  1 1 ^
POUND nH F  S

A S P A R A G U S
White Swan All Green Cut Spears H
IO2 Oz. T in ------23^

4 cans for V  M
FRUIT COCKTAIL a A
HUNT’S ■
No. 300 T in ----- 23^

4 cans for m

G R E E N  B E A N S  g%m
KIMBELL’S CUP aa
No. 303 Tin 15^ JK ̂
4 cans for V e#

P I N E A P P L E
DIAMOND CRUSHED mai H
No. 303 Tin 23̂  JKeA
4 cans for %g jH

FRESH TOMATOES m gk
Fancy No. 1 1
Pound * 1 7

A P P L E  S A U C E  g k ^
APPLE BAT aa
No. 303 Tin 15^

4 cans for are#
O R A N G E S  a  e a 1
Sunkist Navels J  B
Pound m L i-

PINEAPPLE JUICE m
DIAMOND ■ I
46 0 z .T in  33<f a* ̂
3 cans for M J

Green Onions 4 jT
2 bunches lor |  J

CHILI -  Ireland p f Q
NO. 2 TIN ^  ̂

C A R R O T S  O  
Cello. Pkg. 2 /

ALBERT'S GROCERY
& M ARKET - - Phone 4821


