
Public School Week Observance To 
Close With Program Friday Night

Public School Visitation Week 
will close with a program to be 
held in the school auditorium 
Friday night at 7:30. Rev. M. 
JE. Upchurch will be the principal 
speaker for the evening.

The Stratford High School 
Band will appear in several 
musical numbers under the di­
rection of John H. Schnabel.

Miss Wederah Watkins will 
present about 50 students of the 
elementary school in a variety 
o f numbers. First and second 
grade students will make up the 
Rhythm Band. A chorus com­
posed of third, fourth and fifth 
grade students will sing sev­
eral songs that are used in their 
daily class work.

Students have received guests 
in both the elementary and 
liigh school buildings this week 
as they visited the school to 
view displays of the work stu­
dents have completed and to ob­
serve them in their daily classes.

Miss Mildred Bennett, a Strat­
ford High School graduate, who 
has been chosen as an Interna­
tional Foreign Exchange stu­
dent to Germany, was honored 
at a banquet held in the school 
cafeteria Monday night. The 
banquet was sponsored jointly 
by the Stratford Lions Club and 
the Sherman County Farm Bu­
reau, who have sponsored Miss 
Bennett as a candidate for the 
honor she has won.

Rev. H. A. Nichols gave the 
invocation. A cafeteria style 
boiled ham dinner was served 
by the Palace Cafe personnel.

Roscoe Dyess and O. H. Ing­
ham were appointed Lions Club 
tail twisters for the evening and 
kept most of those present sub­
jected to the threats of fines 
for slight misbehaviors. Earl 
Riffe was the first to lose a neck 
tie when he argued with the 
tail twisters over a fine which 
he was assessed.

Kenneth Kendrick served as 
master of ceremonies. He in­
troduced Superintendent R. W. 
Standefifr, Jr., as the first speak­
er of the evening.

Mr. Standefer expressed his 
pleasure in honoring Miss Ben­
nett,-a Stratford High School 
graduate, as a part of the pub­
lic school week program. He 
invited every citizen to visit the 
schools during the week in order 
that they might become better 
acquainted with the work that 
is being carried on.

Mr. Standefer stated that re­
presentatives of the Texas Edu­
cation Agency would visit the 
school system March 23 and 24 
to advise officials of any weak 
points in the school which might 
be improved. He stated that 
he had had the complete coop­
eration of every member of the 
faculty in planning the present 
school program. He believes that 
this cooperation has improved 
morale, and that with the con­
tinued cooperation of the public 
the school may be made as good 
as the public desires.

Although the building pro­
gram has provided the school 
with many advantages, the 
Superintendent stated there is 
still need for an agricultural 
shop, a metal shop, a band room, 
and that physical education in 
the school is handicapped by a 
small gymnasium even though 
the present gymnasium was the 
best in the Panhandle territory 
about 20 years ago. With the 
help and cooperation of the 
public the needs for the child­
ren will be met, he said. Mr. 
Standefer stated that he felt 
that the school had had the co­
operation of the public in every 
activity and that with that con­
tinued cooperation the school 
will be developed in accordance 
with public desires.

A trio composed of Miss Bon­
nie Farris, Miss Carolyn Fol­
som and Miss Cynthia Reed, 
sang a melody of songs. They 
were accompanied on the piano 
by Miss Wederah Watkins.

Cleo Aduddell sang “I ’m Only 
Telling You What Some One 
Told Me,” and as an encore he 
sang “The Angels Are Lighting 
God’s Little Candles.”

Mrs. Arlyn Haile, who served 
Sherman County as a Home 
Demonstration Agent during 
most of the years Miss Mildred 
Bennett accomplished her goals 
as a 4-H club girl, gave a brief 
review of her work in the pro­
gram 1k) “Make the Best Better.” 
In closing her remarks, she in­
troduced Miss Bennett.

Miss Bennett expressed her 
appreciation of what she termed 
as “quite an occasion” for her. 
She stated that she felt honor­

ed and was proud of being se­
lected to make the trip to Ger­
many, It will be an experience 
of sharing what I observe in the 
International Farm Youth Ex­
change program, she said. The 
International Farm Youth Ex­
change program is designed to 
help develop understanding of 
similar peoples all over the 
world with similar backgrounds. 
It was originated at the close of 
World War II when youths gath­
ered to discuss what they migtit 
do to prevent another World 
War. They believed that they 
might begin at the farm fam­
ily level to establish a founda­
tion for understanding with the 
cooperation and help of the 
Extension Cooperative Service.

In 1947 six young British 
farmers came to the United 
States. In 1948 seven Europeans 
came to the United States and 
17 Americans became delegates 
to Europe.

Since the program started, 280 
Americans have visited in Eur­
ope and 212 Europeans have vis­
ited the United States.

Plans are being made to bring 
140 Foreign Exchanges
t o  t h e  U n i t e d
States this year. The grass 
roots ambassadors are supported 
by voluntary contributions. Miss 
Bennett said.

In closing her talk. Miss Ben­
nett said, “I hope to help pro­
mote better world understanding 
by sharing my experiences with 
the most wonderful home town 
people in the world.”

R. C. Buckles, president of the 
Sherman County Farm Bureau, 
spoke briefly. “We have tried 
to stop war with weapons, but I 
think the International For­
eign Youth Exchange program 
may be the solution eventually 
with prayer and the help of al­
mighty God.”

County Agent Ernest Goule, 
president of the Stratford Lions 
Club, made a short talk. He 
complimented Miss Bennett on 
winning her appointment in 
competitive work on a state lev­
el as a state leader in 4-H work. 
He further stated that he be­
lieved she was well prepared to 
represent this country in the 
cause in which she goes abroad, 
“to save democracy and prevent 
a third world war.”

Mr. Goule stated that the two 
foreign exchange students who 
will visit in Sherman County 
this summer may be given a gift 
at the time of their departure 
from th'je homes in which they 
visit but cannot be paid wages 
as farm laborers. “The youths 
visiting here are not to be made 
to feel that they are being paid 
as laborers,” he said.

Miss Jean Spurlock, Miss 
Letha Gail Fedric and MisS Don­
na Fedric sang two songs ac­
companied by Miss Wederah 
Watkins at the piano.

Arrangements are being made 
for Miss Bennett to appear on 
several radio programs.
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Independents And 
P.A.M.C. To Play 
Monday Night

Stratford Independents and 
P.A.M.C. basketball teams will 
play a matched game in the 
Stratford High School gymna­
sium Monday night at 8:00 
o’clock.

P.A.M.C. defeated the Inde­
pendents in a game here Mon­
day night by the score of 65 to 
64. The score was close during 
the entire game.

Pinky Jackson was high point 
man for the Independents with 
20 points.

Stratford Independents will 
meet Stinnett Friday night at 
Cactus in a game to be called at 
7:30 in the district playoffs.

Saturday night the Indepen­
dents and Redimix of Borger are 
favored to meet in the finals to 
be played at 8:30 P. M.

School Trustee 
Election April 4

An election has been ordered 
for Saturday, April 4, for the 
election of two school trustees 
for the Stratford Independent 
School District,

Terms of Dan Foreman and 
O. H. Ingham are expiring.

Applications for a place on 
the ballot must be filed with 
County Judge Bob Ferguson.

Stratford Land 
Mark Falls To 
Wrecking Crew

Wrecking crews leveled the 
frame cafe building belonging 
to Mrs. Albert Lee this week. 
The old Main Street land mark 
is thought to have been erected 
by Herbert and Stewart in 1901 
and was used as a saloon.

Arthur Mullins, who was liv­
ing on the Dick Pincham ranch 
near the present town of Sun- 
ray, came to Stratford in the 
summer of 1902 to purchase 
fence material which had re­
cently been brought in the first 
shipment of materials over the 
Rock Island Railroad, Mr. 
Mullins recalls seeing Col. Col­
ton, who named Stfatford, and 
another man sitting by Potts 
Cafe, which was in the vicinity 
of the wrecked building. The 
Potts Cafe had previously been 
in a tent in the area now oc­
cupied by the stock yards.

Mrs. W. P. Cummings, who 
came to Sherman County with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. D. D. 
Spurlock, in April of 1900, re­
lates that even though she was 
a small child she recalls the ex­
istence of the Potts Cafe. The 
word “Cafe” on the sign was a 
new word to the family and 
they pronounced it the same 
as “Calfv’ She also stated 
that the' Spurlock family 
brought their milk cows to 
Stratford with them, and as the 
cows roamed where they chose, 
they often wandered to the 
Cafe where they raided the 
place where the garbage was 
kept behind the building. Oc­
casionally the cows would come 
home already milked.

Edgar Spurlock and Jim 
Bowling remember the old land* 
mark as a building built by 
Herbert and Stewart for a sa­
loon. They think the Potts 
Cafe was located in another 
building built by Jim Pylant.

Moisture Aids 
Dry Wheat 
Fields

Rain and snow falling Satur­
day night and Tuesday gave 
partial relief to the dry wheat 
fields of Sherman County. Mois­
ture ranged from .32 to .50 of 
an inch over most of the ter­
ritory.

Stratford PTA 
Meeting March 10

A meeting of the Parent- 
Teacher Association will be held 
Tuesday, March 10, at 7:30 P. 
M. in the school auditorium.

Rev. M. E. Upchurch will 
speak on the subject, “The Good 
World.”

An Executive Meeting will be 
held in the office of Supt. R. 
W. Standefer, Jr., at 2:30 P. M. 
on Tuesday, March 10.

Sherman County
Livestock
Winners

A calf shown by William Les­
lie Price was designated Grand 
Champion of the Panhandle at 
the Amarillo Pat Stock Show 
this week. Showing as a light 
weight, those weighing less than 
850 pounds, he placed second 
in that division for the entire 
show. The Panhandle area 
consists of the upper twen­
ty-two counties of the state. 
The steer, a purebred, was bred 
by the Parker-Price herd.

Also in the winning column 
were ^Mary Gay Judd’s Berk- 
shires, placing first and second 
in their class. Roy Mitchell, 
showing his stallion, Tom, was 
awarded a fourth place ribbon.

Competing as the PPA judg­
ing team were Carl Ritchey, Roy 
Lee Newman, and Johnny Sum- 
merour. Results from this con­
test have not been learned.

Davis Family 
Injured In Car 
Collision

Mr, and Mrs. Jessie Davis and 
son, James Milford, were'injur­
ed in a head-on car collision 
on U. S. Highway 54 near Opti­
ma, Oklahoma Wednesday of 
last week.

They were taken to the Guy- 
mon Municipal Hospital for 
treatment. Mrs. Davis is report­
ed to have been the more ser­
iously injured. She suffered 
several fractures of the legs, se­
vere head and face lacerations.

Mr. Davis and his son are 
said to have suffered 
from lacerations and shock.

Johnny F, McMahan of Hook­
er, Oklahoma is reported to 
have been the driver of the oth­
er car involved. His right knee 
was fractured and he had sev­
eral facial lacerations.

Miss Walsh 
Honored At 
Shower

Stratford Exs 
Join W TSC  
Social Clubs

CANYON — Currently pledg­
ing social clubs at West Texas 
State College are three students 
from Stratford and one from 
Kerrick.

Pledging Tau Tau Tau fra­
ternity are Elwood Gillis of 
Stratford and Charles Boren of 
Kerrick. Gillis, a freshman, is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Clyde 
Gillis. Boren, also a fresh­
man, is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Allen Boren.

Edwin Seaman, another W.T.- 
S.C. freshman, is pledging the 
Alpha Sigma Xi fraternity. He 
is the son of Mr, and Mrs. Mar­
vin Seaman of Stratford.

Miss Georgia Lowe, another 
freshman from Stratford, is cur­
rently pledging the Pi Omega 
social sorority. She is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. A. E. 
Lowe.

Studebaker Starlight 
Coupe Appearing 
At TOC Motor Co.

The 1953 Studebaker Com­
mander V-8 Starlight Coupe, a 
new American car with the 
European look, is on display at 
the T.O.C. Motor Co.

The new model car has held 
up formal showing of the ’53 
Studebaker line for several 
weeks.

A pre-nuptial shower honor­
ing Miss Dorothy Walsh, bride- 
elect of Gene Summers, was 
given Monday afternoon in the 
home of Mrs. Gene French. 
Hostesses were Mrs. M. E. Rog­
ers, Mrs. W. D. Heil, Miss Ro- 
wena McAdams, Mrs. Randolph 
McAdams, and Mrs. Gene 
French.

Mrs. W. D. Eller and Mrs. Dee 
Brannan served the guests and 
Mrs. W. D. Heil presided at the 
guest book. Mrs. M. E. Rogers 
received the guests. The serv­
ing table was laid with an im­
ported linen cut work table cloth 
over green. White gladioli, 
white tulips and shasta daisies 
surrounding a miniature bride 
doll formed the centerpiece. The 
guests were served cake topped 
with the bride’s colors of blue 
and green, coffee, rosebud mints 
and an assortment of nuts.

The honoree and her mother 
were presented with a corsage 
of blue carnations tied with 
green ribbon.

Out-of-town guests were Mrs. 
Louis Zaversnik and Mrs. Ther­
esa Smith of Borger, Mrs. F, J. 
Klinke, Linda and Richard of 
Amarillo.

About 40 guests called during 
the afternoon.

4- H Club Girls 
Have Sewing 
Lesson

The Busy Bees and Willing 
Workers 4-H Clubs met Thurs­
day of last week in the club 
room at the court house. Twen­
ty six 4-H Club girls and two 
adult leaders were present.

The group sang three songs 
led by Norma Bachman. They 
were 4-H Girl, 4-H Trail and 
Down in the Old Cherry Or­
chard.

Miss Lucile King, County 
Home Demonstration Agent, 
demonstrated lasdng a pattern, 
cutting an apron or skirt, mark­
ing and assembling a garment. 
One apron and one skirt were 
cut, marked and assembled at 
this meeting..

Two new members were added 
to the roll.

The adult leaders present 
were Mrs. Arthur Judd and Mrs. 
Everett Riggs.

The girls will learn to put in 
a zipper at the next meeting. 
Each girl will bring some ma­
terial, a zipper, needle, thread, 
thimble and scissors.

MORE EDUCATION FOR THE MASSES

Gore Well Breaks 
Long Period 
Of Inactivity

The long period of oil and gas 
play inactivity in Sherman 
County was broken this week 
by the announcement of the 
drilling location of the Kerr-Mc- 
Gee Oil Industries Gore No. 1. 
The well will be drilled 1,320 feet 
from the west and 2,640 feet 
from the north line of section 
52 in Block 3-T.
One Well Tested

Stanolind Oil & Gas Company 
Foreman No. 1 in section 446 of 
Block 1-T, has a deliverability 
test of 9.927 million cubic feet 
of gas with a rock pressure of 
362 pounds. The well produced 
pay between the depths of 2,965 
and 3,258 feet.

Bride-To-Be ■ 
Complimented 
With Shower

A pre-nuptial shower honor­
ing Virginia Elliott Mackey was 
given Thursday of last week by 
Mrs. Leonard Plunk and Mrs. 
Jodie Reesing in the home of 
Mrs. Leonard Plunk.

Arrangements of white carna­
tions and blue iris were used 
throughout the entertaining 
rooms and the gifts were beau­
tifully arranged around the 
guest book and special flower 
centerpiece just in front of the 
seat of honor especially arrang­
ed for the bride-elect and her 
mother.

From the beautiful lace- 
laid serving tables with a silver 
service, coffee, cake, nuts and 
mints were served throughout 
the evening.

Mrs. Bob Marshall presided at 
the coffee service' and Miss 
Wanda Wilson served the bri­
dal-decorated cake.

Those attending and sending 
gifts were Mrs. Leonard Weaver 
of Sunray, Mrs. H. A. Nichols, 
Mrs. W. S. Frizzell, Sr., Mrs. M. 
J. Carter, Mrs. North Elliott, 
Mrs. C. C. Plunk, Mrs. Jodie 
Reesing, Mrs. A. L. Wilson, Mrs. 
Leonard Plunk, Mrs. Robert 
O’Quin, Mrs. Lucille Brown, Mrs. 
Burk Green, Mrs. V. A. Plunk, 
Mrs. Bob Marshall, Mrs. John 
Kidwell, Mrs. Carroll Wisdom, 
IVIrs. Marguerite Wilson, Mrs. 
Jewel Peterson, Mrs. Margaret 
Mrs. Wilma Lee Cameron, Mrs. 
Gardner, Mrs. Evelyn Barker, 
J. W. Flores, Miss Wanda Wilson, 
Miss Doris Ballinger and Miss 
Martha Plunk.

Busy Bee 4-H Club 
Has Sewing Lesson

The Busy Bee 4-H Club met 
Thursday of last week at the 
court house. The roll was call­
ed by the president, Ann Bur­
gess. The 4-H prayer, pledge 
and motto was repeated as the 
opening exercise. The song 
leader led the group in singing 
4-H Girl and 4-H Trail. Miss 
Lucile King led the song, Down 
in the Old Cherry Orchard.

The Willing Workers met with 
the Busy Bees at this meeting.

Those present in the Busy Bee 
group were Norma Bachman, 
Carolee Baskin, Ann Burgess, 
Doris Dortch, Sharon Gamble, 
Mary Gay Judd, La Ruth Ken­
drick, Kay Pickens, Gay Plunk, 
Joanne Roper, Margie Parrish, 
Jessie Jean Riggs, Nanfreda and 
Norvita Bammes.

New members attending were 
Robbie Jo Burkham, Ginger 
Shirley Brooks and Barbara 
Lavake.

Willing Worker Club members 
attending were Ann Bradley, 
Glenda Green, Patricia Newman, 
Linda Riffe, and Mary Sue Tay­
lor.

The president named a secre­
tary for the Busy Bee Club and 
Mrs. E. E. Riggs appointed a 
secretary for the Willing Work­
ers.

Miss Lucile King, county home 
demonstration agent, showed 
the group how to cut out apron 
and skirt patterns.

Lester Hurst 
Hospitalized 
By Injuries

Lester C. Hurst, Jr., 27-year 
old son of Mr. and Mrs. L. C. 
Hurst, was hospitalized in San 
Barnardino, California Monday 
of last week as the result of in­
juries. Hurst was in charge of 
a highline construction crew. 
The lines were being raised over 
a highway intersection and 
Hurst was directing traffic when 
he was struck by a car. He is 
suffering from leg and back 
injuries. His condition is not 
considered serious.

84 Year Old 
Resident Visits 
Business District

L. N. Lee, 84-year old Strat­
ford resident, who has been 
confined to his home by ill 
health for a period of years, 
spent about 1^2 hours in the 
business district Monday morn­
ing visiting with old friends.

Fire Siren 
Moved To 
City Hall

Stratford’s fire siren was 
moved to a location just be­
hind the City Hall this week. 
The telephone number to report 
a fire still remains the same 
4444 number. The siren has 
been reconditioned and is now 
more or less centrally located. 
Several sharp blasts Monday 
morning caused alarm. There 
were no fires. The boys were 
merely testing the siren after 
moving it to its new location.

Mildred Crabtree 
Circle Meets With 
Mrs. Green

The Mildred Crabtree Circle 
of the Baptist Women’s Mis­
sionary Union met in the home 
of Mrs. W. D. Green for a Bible 
Study program Wednesday af­
ternoon. Mrs. P. C. Adkins, 
Circle Chairman, conducted the 
business meeting and it was de­
cided to divide the Mildred 
Crabtree Circle into two circles.

A community missions basket 
was discussed and decided upon 
and members are to take can­
ned goods to the home of Mrs. 
V. M. King, Community Missions 
Chairman.

It was announced that the 
District W. M. U. meeting was to 
be held in Borger, April 17, and 
plans were made for attending 
this meeting.

Mrs. Arlyn Haile presented 
the Bible Study program and 
delicious refreshments were serv­
ed Mesdames Arlyn Haile, Ivan 
Bammes, H. B. Norris, Kenneth 
Kendrick, W. D. Green, Mike 
Burgess, L. L. Grimes, E. W. But­
ler, L. J. Davis, M. J. Carter, M. 
E. Upchurch, Roy Allen, P. C. 
Adkins, H. L. Haile, Howard Haf- 
fey, and V. M. King.

The next meeting will be held 
on March 11 in the church when 
Royal Service will be held. The 
meeting will begin at 10:00 A. M. 
and will continue with a covered 
dish luncheon and into the af­
ternoon for the W. M. U. obser-  ̂
vance of the week of prayer. 
Ladies attending will bring a 
covered dish. , ,
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Want Ads
HAVE SOLD some real bar­

gains but still have some left in 
homes, vacant lots and small 
ranches. We trade — make us 
an offer. See me for Polio In­
surance at such a small cost you 
can’t afford to be without it. — 
C. E. Hill at Stratford Insurance 
Agency. 22-2tc
FOR SALE: My home in Strat­
ford. — .Art Ross. 12-tfc

HOME For Sale: Furnished 
or imfurnished. Home has 3 
bedrooms, 2 bath rooms, extra 
large living room and kitchen, 
2 room basement, carpeting, 
Venetian blinds, draperies. Dou­
ble garage and other buildings. 
Located 1-2 block from school.— 
Claude Sloan. 50-tfc

FOR SALE: Story and half 
stucco house. Nine rooms and 
tile bath with floor furnace, 
electric hot water heater. Dou­
ble garage, storm cellar and 
storage building 20x40. Locat­
ed on four lots at Chestnut and 
6th. Cash or terms. Phone 
2611. — Leo L. Smith. 1-tfc

NEW MODELS of the Kelvin- 
ator Refrigerators and Home 
Freezers now in stock. — Van B. 
Boston. 42-tfc

FOR SALE: Two good used 
Ford Tractors, several other mo­
dels and makes. — Stratford 
Tractor Co. 3-tfc

IF YOU HAVE any kind of 
carpenter work, cabinet or shop 
work, see Earl C. Garoutte.

13-tfc
SAWS sharpened with a power 

saw sharpener. See E. E. Ham­
ilton at Hamilton Machine Shop. 
All work guaranteed. 25-tfc

FOR RENT: Four room mod­
ern house. — Joe Walsh. 15-tfc

Long distance household mov­
ing. Years of service your guar­
antee of satisfaction. —Bruce & 
Son Transfer and Storage, 
Phone 192, Borger, Texas. 29-tfc

NEW and Used Sewing Ma­
chines for sale. Repairs and 
parts for any make of machine. 
Also machines for rent. — Dal- 
hart Sewing Machine Exchange, 
105 West 2nd Street, Phone 70, 
Dalhart, Texas. ' 52-tfc

FREE PICK-UP on dead stock. 
— Dalhart Rendering Co., Call 
Collect 417-W. 16-tfc

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY — 
$250 MONTHLY SPARE TIME. 
Refilling and collecting money 
from new type 5c candy vending 
machines in this immediate 
area. No selling; to qualify for 
work you must have car, refer­
ences, $600.00 cash, secured by 
inventory. Devoting six hours 
week to business, your end on 
percentage of collections will 
net up to $250.00 monthly with 
very good possibilities of taking 
over full time. Income increas­
ing accordingly. For interview, 
include phone in application. 
Write P. O. Box 1054, Dallas, 
Texas. 16-6tp

FOR SALE: My 7-room resi­
dence on Fourth and Maple. — 
Paul Aduddell. 18-tfc

MONUMENTS — 1102 Elm 
Street — Charley Hays — Dal­
hart, Texas. 19-3tp-tfc

WANTED: Housekeeper; must 
have references; house avail­
able; excellent salary. — Mrs. 
W. N. Price, Phone 3071. 19-tfc

PIANOS — Will have repre­
sentative in this vicinity shortly 
to dispose of two spinets, one 
studio and two upright pianos. 
These pianos must be sold at 
once to retire present obligation 
against them. If you want a 
bargain, write or phone Credit 
Department, McBrayer Piano 
Co., 217 West 6th, Amarillo, Tex­
as. 20-3tc

Want Ads
FOR RENT: Small furnished 

house. — Arthur Folsom. 20-tfc
DISC SHARPENER — plow re­

paired — Lav/n mowers sharp­
ened and repaired. Let me hear 
EARLY and your machine will 
be ready when you need it. — 
Bill Steel, 201 North Bliss, Dial 
2-6886, Dumas. One block East 
on Borger Highway, one block 
North. 22-9tc

FOR SALE: Extension dining 
table and eight chairs, maple 
finish. Reasonable. — Mrs. 
Lorel Haile. 21-2tp

FOR SALE: one set of laundry 
cement tubs and mixing fau­
cets for $15.00. — S. J. Lavake.

22-ltp

ORDER AND NOTICE OF 
CITY ELECTION

I, H. M. Flores, Mayor of the 
City of Stratford, Texas, by 
virtue of the power vested in 
me by law, do hereby order that 
an election be held in the City 
of STRATFORD, on April 7th 
1953, same being the first Tues­
day thereof, for the purpose of 
electing the following officers 
of said city:

Three councilmen for a term 
of two years, and that said elec­
tion shall be held at the City 
HALL in said city, and Mr. 
Arthur Folsom is hereby ap­
pointed manager thereof.

A copy of this order and notice 
of election shall be posted at 
t h e  c i t y  h a l l ,  the 
p l a c e  w h e r e  this 
election will be held, thirty days 
before the date of said election.

Signed and executed this the 
24th day of February 1953.

H. M. FLORES 
Mayor, City of Stratford 

W. P. FOREMAN 
City Clerk. 21-2tc

How To Meet 
T omorrow

Does this worry you in your 
family finances? Or do you 
have a family plan for spending 
that will take care of tomorrow?

According to Miss Lucile King, 
County Home Demonstration 
Agent, a family plan that pro­
vides the wants and needs dur­
ing the year will better enable 
you to meet the demands on the 
family purse.

The agent suggests a family 
get-together around the table 
to talk about these wants and 
needs. After listing all of the 
big items, discuss what can be 
done to reach those goals. This 
may be the year Junior finish­
es high school or starts to col­
lege. This may be the year 
some other family member needs 
glasses. Or, it may be the year 
to build the new home. What­
ever the individual or family 
wants and needs, there are cer­
tain demands like income tax, 
insurance, payments on debts 
and everyday living expenses 
that have to be metr̂ ^

The finance plan should be 
made according to the family’s 
pattern of living. Consider the 
Jones family good neighbors, 
the agent says,' but make your 
own standards to suit your own 
family spending plan. It will 
become a good money-manager 
for meeting today’s and tomor­
row’s needs, a .plan for good 
family living.

Leonardo da Vinci, the paint­
er, wrote from right to left.

A pound of ice occupies more 
space than a pound of water.

I
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MAKE SECURITY
Your Beacon for ’53

/
NOW ------  while times still o ffer an opportunity for

prosperity ------  is the time to put m oney aside for  the
future. And there’s no better place to save your m oney 
than here in  this bank.

Accounts Federally Insured Up To
$10,000.00T h e First State B an k

OF STRATFORD

HURRICANE KILLS HUNDREDS'. . . Hurricane and floods which 
struck England, Belgium and Holland brought death to 1,500 in 
worst storm in 500 years. Photo shows three residents of Canvey 
Island, England, who were evacuated with 13,000 others.

MAYOR McGUP By John Jarvis
lAA BUYIMG AN ANTIQUE 
DULCIMER FOR MY WIFE'S 
birthday',M ISS LEED

MISS PHOTOFLASH . . . Myrna 
Hansen, 18, of Palatine, HI., was 
chosen “ Miss Photoflash of 1953”  
by Chicago photographers. Myrna 
won $500, resort vacation and 
movie contract.

PET LION . . . Teen-age Martha Sweney, farm girl of Bushnell, 
lU., playfully wrestles with her 5-month-old lion cub, “ Simba.”

Charles Goodyear invented 
vulcanized rubber.

IT’S TIME TO HAVE

YOUR
CLOTHES

CLEANED
FOR EASTER

Check Your Wardrobe Now! 
WE CLEAN

Men’s Suits, Men’s Topcoats, 
Men’s Slacks, Ladies’ Dresses, 

Ladies’ Suits, Ladies’ Skirts

LUCY K U P 
CLEANERS

New

’53 Model

Studebakers
Are On 
Display

TOC Motor Co,
Studebaker Cars And Trucks

tea*

Here is Chrysler Quality
at SURPRISINGLY LOW  COST!

v>s .PS ^

• I f you’re “ budget-minded,”  this may astonish you ; ; ;
« . . .  this stunning new Chrysler Windsor can be had for 

little more than a low-priced car with all its extras!
• Here’s Chrysler quality and prestige at modest 

cost. Plus Chrysler size, comfort, and safety, too!
• Famous Spitfire engine is a joy  to command . ; : 

in every driving situation!
• Full-time Power Steering, if you wish 

it, lets you turn and park with the gentlest o f 
guidance. N o wheel fight, ever!

• Immediate response, too . . . you don’t have to turn the 
steering wheel so much to turn the front wheels.

It’s safer all ways!
• Revolutionary Onflow shock absorbers waft you 

vover roughest roads as gently as you’d carry a basket o f eggs!
•' Chrysler engineering has added more new improve­

ments . . .  first. . .  to motor cars than all others put together!
• I f your next new car means a “ big decision”  on your

part, isn’t it smart to investigate the most thafs to be had?j 
: ;  especially when it’s priced below all normal expectation!

The beautiful

CHRYSLER WINDSOR -one of America's first family of fine cal^

GARRISON MOTOR CO.
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Pan Files
Do you have trouble finding 

and using trays and pans stored 
in your kitchen? Miss Lucile 
King, Home Demonstration 
Agent, says there is an efficient 
way to store these. ^

She suggests vertical or hori­
zontal filing space for shallow 
pans. The files may be built 
as a unit and set on a shelf or 
in a drawer, or they may be 
built in permanently if remov­
able dividers are used. The 
dividers can be made of plywood, 
hardboard, metal, thin crate 
wood or any other thin material.

J P Powell
M. D.

Eye, Ear, Nose, 
and Throat

Dalhart Texas

— Dr, Harry Arnold 
— Dr. Edwina Arnold

Drs. Arnold & 
Arnold

Chiropractors
X -R a y  Colon Therapy

713 Keeler Ave.
Phone 604 Dalhart, Texas

DORTCH 
SHOE SHOP

Let Us Repair Those W orn 
Shoes For the Family

Candies 
Cold Drinks

Mr. and Mrs. G. C. 
Dortch, Owners

IF  THEY ARE TO BE

WASHED
DRYED

Or DYED  
Phone —  4251

BRYAN’S
Bendix Laundry
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Bryan

Make the dividers of such a 
shape and size they will not in­
terfere with grasping the stored 
pan or article. ^

A slanting horizontal file may 
be used for platters and trays 
that are too wide to set on a 
shelf. Narrow cleats can hold 
the dividers in place.

Conde Donelson 
In Amarillo Hospital

Conde Donelson was admitted 
to Northwwest Texas Hospital 
in Amarillo Tuesday as a medi­
cal patient.

LEGS COUNT . . . Legs are 
eqoaUy important to race-horses 
and pretty girls, and here com­
paring theirs are Bhoda Wetz 
and “ March Time.”  Scene is 
Miami’s Hialeah track.

JET FIGHTER . . . America’s 
first jet ace, Maj. James Jabara 
of Wichita, Kan., grins on return 
from mission against Bed MIGS 
in Korea.

We Help 
You Save

ON CAR DRIVING 
COSTS And REPAIRS

Any shop man can spot trouble af­

ter it’s howling at him. But our men are 

craftsmen — they can spot a ‘ ‘little” 

trouble and fix it in a jiffy at small cost 

to you BEFORE it has a chance to grow 

and cost you real money. That’s the 

value of our service to you. Ask our 

customers.

Garrison Motor Co.
Your Chrysler-Plymouth Dealer

Frank Smith 
In V A  Hospital

Frank Smith was taken to the 
Veterans Hospital in Amarillo 
Monday night in the Wilson 
ambulance. Mr. Smith was re­
leased by the hospital a few 
weeks ago where he was a sur­
gical patient.

Circle 8 Square 
Dance Club To 
Meet Saturday

Circle 8 Square Dance Club 
members will meet in the Amer­
ican Legion Hall at 8:00 P. M. 
Saturday.

I REMEMBER
SY THE OLDTXlfERS

From Mrs. C. D. Hale, Route Z, 
Mart, Texas: I remember when af­
ter a quilting bee a cat was put 
in the middle of the quUt and the 
one he jumped out by was supposed 
to be the next bride.

From Mrs. Melvin Ingelretson, 
Thornton, Iowa: I remember when 
my mother made her own mat­
tresses. They were made of feather 
ticking, buttoned down the center. 
There were ten children in our fam­
ily and mother made mattresses 
for all the beds. Every faU, in corn 
picking time, she would take a 
sack and go into the field and pick 
the softest corn husks for each 
ticking. ......

From Mrs. J. J. Markle, Under­
hill, Vermont: I remember when 
my grandmother used to plump up 
the cornhusks in her mattress each 
morning. The furniture in her room 
was a set of valuable antiques. 
She made tallow candles in the old- 
time molds, knit her stocking and 
mittens for us children. I can still 
remember getting into the spool 
bed in the guest room that was al­
ways mine; the fragrance of sweet 
clover that she always put in her 
linen chest; the caraway cookies 
and strings of apples drying over 
the old range; and the copper ket­
tles and brass candlesticks. One 
of the candlesticks and snuffer and 
tray are today among my treas­
ures.

From Mrs. H. E. Chrisman, 
Scottsbluff, Nebraska: I remember 
when I made all my husband’ s 
shirts. They were the old fashioned 
kind that had to be pulled on over 
the head.

From Mrs. W. H. Taylor, 3451 
Summer Street, Eureka, Calif.: 1
remember when I lived in Kansas 
the snow was so deep we had to 
reach down to hang our washing on 
the clothesline. Also clerking in a 
store from 8 a.m. to 11 p.m. for 
$3.75 a week.

Send contfibutions to The Old 
Timer, Community Press Service, 
McClure Bldg., Frankfort, Ky.

Chemicals can be applied to the 
cotton plant to cause it to shed its 
leaves prematurely to make pick­
ing easier.

Retail coal merchants in this 
country distributed in excess of 70 
million tons of bituminous coal in 
1952.

The greatest tonnage of river 
traffic in the United States is car­
ried on,the Ohio and its tributaries.

Illinois produced more than 10 
per cent of the nation’s total coal 
supply in 1952.

R o x y  Theatre
STRATFORD.TEXAS

STARTING TIME 
WEEK DAYS 6:45 P. M.
SATURDAY ...............  5:15 P. M.
SUNDAY .....................  2:15 P. M.

MARCH 6 And 7
Sir Walter Scott’s

IVANHOE
Color by TECHNICOLOR

Starring Robert Taylor, Eliza­
beth Taylor, Joan Fontaine, 

George Sanders and 
Emlyn Williams

MARCH 8 And 9

Miracle of Fatima
W ith Gilbert Roland and 

Angela Clark

MARCH 10

ROUGE’S M ARCH
W ith Peter Lawford 

------  PLUS ------

Valley Of Fire
W ith Gene Autry 

MARCH 11 And 12

City Beneath The Sea
starring Robert Ryan, Anthony 

Quinn, Mala Powers and 
Suzan Bail

SEA DART . . . The Navy’s SF2Y-1 sea-dart experimental jet fighter 
seaplane is first combat plane to use hydro-skis for rough water 
landing and takeoff.

MAYOR McGUP By John Jarvis

Oklahoma Couple 
Married Wednesday

Miss Ann Hurrell and Wil­
liam Noble, Guymon, were mar­

ried in the parsonage of the 
First Christian Church Wednes­
day of last week by Rev. John 
Reaves. They secured their 
marriage license in Stratford.

• • #

Tl-nS ROAD MEANDERS ABOUT] 
SIX  M ILES, THEN IT TURNS 
INTO A  NARROW TRAIL, 
THEN BECOME^ A COW  
PATH. AFTER ABOUT TOO 
YARDS IT  RUNS UP AN .

A N D  I T
ENDS IN A ,  7 dVOU EXPECT

Kn o t h o l e / \ mb to beub/e i
------W  T U A T ?

It  costs a lot to be an American. But not too 
much. The American principle of personal and 
economic liberty provides more opportunity and 
more good for more people than any other sys­
tem devised by man. Privately owned and oper­
ated industry is the American principle at work.

In America, private industry pays its own way. 
Pays the lion’s share of taxes necessary to support 
our government. Were it not for private, tax- 
paying industry your individual tax would be 
much greater —  for the burden of government 
would rest entirely on your shoulders.

Paste this in your hat. And when you file your 
income tax return, take off your hat to the Amer­
ican way of life.

CiNERAl TELEPHONE COMPANY
of the Southwest

1953 Studebaior-JCommander V-8 StaiUglit Coupe. White sidewa ’ ‘ ’ r-s, chrome Ttteel discs— iglare-reducuat im ted glass— optional at extra cost.
Actual photograph

Presenting
the New 1953 StudebEker

'7 ^M VTfM em m t cm
It’s dliTiost unbelievably low! It’s impressively long and wide! 

If has the sleek-lined smartness of a costly foreign cor' 
and it’s right down to earth in price!

The completely new, sensationally 
different 1953 Studebaker unquestion­
ably is the most daring step forward of 
our times in automobile design.
Here, first by far in an American car, is 
the continental charm of Europe’s most 
distinguished cars— an impressively long 
new Studebaker that is so very low most 
people can see over its top!
Come in and find out about the exdt- 

_ , , , r * !.• i. f ing new 1953 Studebaker— Carnatic inIt’s less than five feet high I » i n . ,  i i . . i
, verve and flau*—breath-taking m beauty 1953 Studebaker Starhner hard-top convertible I . . j  n . • i t .̂ j *

mside as well as outside, rm d out how
down to earth in price it really is.Truly a new flight into the future I

A brand new type of 
Power Steering

A Studebaker exclusive—available in 
Commander V-8 at moderate extra cost 

★
Huge new expanses of 
safety glass all around

A ll models—Champions and Commander 
V-8s—hove one-piece rear windows os 

well os windshields 
★

A new and safer 
low center of gravity
b gWet the car rood-tight stability 

on sharp turns os well os curves

T. O. C. MOTOR CO
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See the SY L V A N IA  Movie Clear

F TELEVISION SET 'O'

To' Be Given Away March 28
Nothing to Buy. No Obligation, and you 

don ’t have to be present to win. Just Sign your 
nam e and drop in the box. Ask Checkers for 
your Free Tickets every time you are in our store. 
The more tickets you have the better chance you 
have to win.

A1 be r t’ s
A  NAM E LIKE A  BRAND

It Stands For High Quality Merchandise 
Sold At Low Prices '

B A C O N  S s " " "  4 5 c T U N A  FISH  | 9 c
OnfTrVP Colorado Reds OA I 
O r U l/U  50 Pound Bag P IN E A P P LE 2 8 c

WHOLE OR HALF
H AM S C A c
Arm our’s Star or Pinkney Sunray Pound

O VAL SARDINES
In  Mustard or Tom ato Sauce 15 OZ. TIn4m*V

i

ORANGES A c
SUNKIST POUND Jp

PEARS
Hearts Delight _ No. 303 Tin ^ 4 *

S A U S A G E  2 5 c
T 1 UK ■ Oscar Meyers
Luncheon Meat 13 oz. hn 3 9 c A DDT 17 C Starking Delicious ^  mm

A r r L t o  ^ocnd 1 / C T O M A T O  JU IC E  fe '^ S ^ T iN  2 7 c

STEAK  C Q c
Loin, T -B one Or Club, Grain Fed Pound

SYRUP Z a c
W hite Swan Pure Ribbon Cane, ^ Gal. Bucket W BELL PEPPERS f  A c

NO. 1 FLORIDA POUND A  #
PINEAPPLE JUICE A A c
Hearts Delight No. 2 Tin 2 For 'iBi4F

n  C Sugar Cured
Bacon oquares pound 2 y c P R E SE R V E S S h .S' 5 2 c LE T T U C E  po! nS‘™ " '““  ̂ i Q c

a va  Hearts Delight ^
N E C T A R  2 5 c

SHORTENING Z O c
MRS. TUCKER’S 3 Pound Carton V 7

M ALTED MILK A A c
Kraft, Chocolate, 1 LB. JAR
PLAIN, 1 POUND JAR ..................................................... 45c

COFFEE A A c
WHITE SWAN POUND /  Jp

TO M ATO ES A f t
NO. 303 ’n N  2 FOB 3  A

Southern Maid ^

O LEO  1 9 c D R Y  M ILK  = S r  2 5 c FL O U R  8 9 c
Monte

1 I 1 Iv IM Cream Style W hite ^  ■ O 
No. 303 Tin At A ^

BISCUITS 1  A c
Puffin, Ready To Eat, 10 Biscuit Tube A w BORDEN’S MILK A A c

BORDEN’S Tall Cans 2 FOB A  I p
CRACKERS
SUPREME SALAD WAFERS 2 LB. BOX 1

W A X  b e a n s  a a c
Silver Dollar No. 303 Tin 2 For

C H E E SE  F 0 0 D ~ " r . " S 9 c TID E 2 9 c : P E A C H E S S ’lT  1 9 c  1 P O R K  & B E A N S r s i s - i o c

SALAD DRESSING f  A c
MORTON’S PINT J L  J p

TOILET SOAP 7  A c  1 FRUIT COCKTAIL A 1  c I ASPARAGUS CUT SPEARS A  A c
HONEYSUCKLE 4 Regular Bars For I  HUNTS NO. 303 TIN J i  A  I  Winslows No. 1 Tin

Albert’s Grocery & Market PHONE4821
FREE FREE FREE

Photo Contest
Albert’s Grocery Extends An Invitation To All Mothers To Enter Their 
Children In A Big Child’s Photo Contest To Be Held In Albert’s Grocery 
in Stratford, Texas from 9:00 A. M. until 6:00 P. M.

Tuesday, March 10th, Only
AT ALBERT’S GROCERY And MARKET

GRAND PRIZES
11x14 BRUSHED OIL

PORTRAIT
A Regular $17.95 Value

11x14 REGULAR

OIL PORTRAIT
A Regular $11.95 Value

11x14 REGULAR

OIL PORTRAIT
A Regular $11.95 Value

To enter your child in the contest come to Albert’s Gro­
cery any time on Tuesday, March 10, between 9 :00  A . 
M. and 6 :00  P. M. to be photographed for the contest.

Age limits for the contest are from 1 month to 12 years.

Note there is no entrance fee and you are not obligated 
to buy anything. Children will be photographed by 
highly skilled Child’s Photographer.

\

All Work Done by Shugarts Studio of Levelland, Texas

I

Come to Albert’s Grocery on March 10th
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STRATFORD GRADE SCHOOL 
NEWS

First Grade
Mrs. Gardner’s Room

We elected our president, Phil 
D, Dettle, and vice-president,

Judy Hudson. They will serve 
one week, then we shall vote 
again. We have a librarian 
and assistant librarian, different 
pupils taking care of these du-

Two Odd Lot Tables Of LADIES’ AND MISSES’

DRESS AND SPORTS 
SHOES

Your Choice o f  any 
Fair o f Shoes on 

One Table

. . .  o i

R oss B ros. D ry  G oods
FO R  S A L E :  My Equity
In is/ ew 3-Bedroom Brick House On 

Double Lot ^

F.H.A. APPROVED FOR LOAN LOCATED lOTH

AND MAPLE

SEE

JOHN H. SCHNABEL
AT HIGH SCHOOL BAND HALL

Aerial Seeding
(iOc PER a c r e

For further information Call 5081 Boise 
City, Oklahoma Collect

FARMERS CROP SERVICE
BOISE CITY, OKLAHOMA

i k o n  o n e  c n e a m ?  

W H A T N O N S E N S E !”

Now you con ovoid the waste and bother 
of many creams and oils with the NEW  
Ann Delofield All-Purpose Deep Cream. 
This single, gold-topped {or contains 
all of the ingredients for cleaning, 
smoothing and refreshing your skin.
And this is |ust.the beginning of a 
whole new cosmetic line—vitomin-cenfered 
to give you the most for your cosmetic 
dollar, look for Ann Delofield Deep Cream 
and beauty aids ot your Rexoll store.

ties each day. We have learn­
ed to “take turns” and that 
“turn about is fair play.”

We enjoyed having our moth­
ers come to school. We en­
joyed the pop-corn balls too.

Third Grade
Miss Ballinger’s Room

All of us are in school today.
B a r t o n wasD a l e

absent one day last 
week because of illness. Tom­
my Lovett and Cleo Aduddell 
were absent one-half day each.

Fifth Grade
Mrs. Elliott’s Room

We are very happy to welcome 
our parents as visitors. Our 
most helpful visitor this far is 
little two year old Lu Ann 
Plunk. She raised her hand 
to offer information on the 
materials we were working on 
before some of us did.

We are having fun in arith­
metic learning to make change 
as a courteous clerk would make 
change to an appreciative cus­
tomer.

The dress of the week is a 
red and white check with white 
trim worn by Sammie Beall.

In Geography we are viewing 
the Great Plains States as a 
land of vast open spaces. We 
are making a special study of 
the length of the growing sea­
son and the new kinds of plants 
that are being introduced into 
the section.

Mrs. Flowers’ Room
Perfect papers in Spelling last 

week were: Hal Bennett, Linda 
Coffman, Molly Ann Davis, Mary 
Gay Judd, Raymond Keener, 
Dixie Lee Knight, Kay Pickens, 
Jessie Jean Riggs, and Sharon 
Gamble.

We have enjoyed having visit­
ors in our room during National 
Education Week.

The bulletin boards are tak­
ing on a green look as St. Pat­
rick’s Day posters are being put 
up.

The exams are over and now 
grade cards.-

We have some new moss and 
fern in our fishbowl. Mrs. 
Bennett brought it when she re­
turned from her recent trip to 
Port Isabel.

The Art classes are making 
chalk drawings of Island sun­
sets and sailboats.

Mary Gay Judd scored again. 
This time she won a first and 
second on her pigs shown in 
Amarillo.

Several in our room have 
been absent due to illness. We 
wish them a speedy recovery and 
hope that they will be back in 
school with us again soon.

JUI-Purpost DEEP CREAM 
All you neod for ooiy moko-wp 
vomovol, doop basic cloonting 
«nd deop skin softening. 
3.35-oz. ior . . . . . .  $1.50
Economy size » •  « .  .  $2.75

<si IjoH/i

LIPSTICK. Indelible, 
cleor-cdging. Five stopper 
shades, $1.25

french Formula FACE POWDER 
Built-in foundation. Five shades, $1-S0

Am OslancM VITAMINS
For o lovelier you. Take them every
doy. One month’s supply, $2.95

$Km FRESHENER Scientific
pore cleanser, skn stlmuionf, $1.SD

COMPACT Contains Qu)k-On 
inoscoro, shadww, eyebrow pencil 

>1 «ttd liner. Pony. $5.00. Purse, $2 .00
i

C0108NC Cenesntroted,
.  leeg-lesting, $2.50

All prices plus ton (except -vlloaitttt>

City Drug

Sixth Grade
Miss Cox’ Room

(Mary Sue Taylor, Reporter)
We would like to express our 

appreciation for the beautiful 
bouquet of pink carnations giv­
en̂  to our room by Mrs. Earl 
Riffe.

The people visiting our room 
Monday were: Mrs. Spurlock, 
Mrs. Norris, Mrs. Johnson and 
Larry Norris. We are hoping 
rnore patrons will visit us this 
week.

Larry Goule was grand-cham­
pion on his 4-H club calf at 
Dalhart last week. He has en­
tered his calf in the stock show 
in Amarillo this week.

Glenda Green is absent from 
school today,

Patricia Newman, Robert 
Ragsdale and Cagle Kendrick 
will go with the band on a trip 
Saturday.

Several girls and boys from 
this class will play in the basket 
ball tournament Saturday at 
Channing.

Larry Goule and William Price 
won Grand Championship of 
the Panhandle on the calf in the 
4-H club show at Amarillo Tues­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Spurlock 
returned Wednesday from a 
visit with relatives in Navasota, 
Texas for a week.

Mrs. Bud Parvin and her sis­
ter, Mrs. Roscoe Folsom of Sun- 
ray, left Tuesday for Hering- 
ton, Kansas, for a visit with 
their sister, Mrs. Norman Kerns, 
who is ill, and her family.

W. W. Davis was a business 
visitor in Amarillo Monday.

Al7c Boyd McWilliams of 
Smoky Hill Air Force Base, Kan­
sas, spent the week end with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Mc­
Williams.

Mrs. B. J. Bullard, the former 
Miss Almeta Jo Wall, who has 
been with her husband in Wich­
ita Falls, Texas, is visiting her 
aunt and uncle, Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Guthrie, and other 
relatives. Her husband was 
recently transferred to Chanute 
Field, Illinois.

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Plunk*and 
children have moved to their 
home on South Main 
Street. ^

Mr. and Mrs, Arthur Ross, 
Mrs. Lorraine Mehner and Ann 
Frances were dinner guests in 
the Art Ross home Sunday.

Mrs. Elmer Gquin, Mrs. Bill 
French, Mrs. J. W. Green, Mrs. 
Walter Lee and Sandy French 
were visitors in Dumas Wed­
nesday. . V ,

Mrs. Van B. Boston and Mrs. 
V. H. Sanders were visitors in 
Amarillo Tuesday.

Mrs. Lelah Boney and Mrs. 
Bessie Hodges spent the week 
end visiting in the horde of Mr. 
and Mrs. Kirkpatrick ahd child­
ren in Liberal, Kansas, Jimmy 
Blazier returned home with his 
grandmother.

Mrs. Jessie Wilson spent last 
week in the home' of Mr. and 
Mrs. Wilbur Wilson near Hart­
ley.

Mr. and Mrs. G. Ross Turner 
left Sunday for Dallas, Texas 
to visit his brother who is ill in 
a Dallas hospital. They ex­
pect to return home this week.

Mrs. H. M. Brown was brought 
home Thursday of last week 
from Northwest Texas Hospital, 
where she recently underwent 
surgery for a farctured hip.

Mr. and Mrs. C, C. Yates, 
Arroyo Grande, California, are 
guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. F. L. Yates this week. Mr. 
and Mrs. Harry Vincent, Tex- 
homa, were guests in the Yates 
home Sunday.

Mrs. W. D. Ellis left Thursday 
to visit relatives and friends in 
Texhoma for a few days.

Walter Schafer, Amarillo, was 
a business visitor here Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Pronger 
and P. J. Pronger, Sr., returned 
Thursday night of last week 
from Tampa, Florida where they 
have been spending the winter.

Van B, Boston left Tuesday 
morning on a business trip to 
Dallas, Texas.

Mr. and Mrs. J. P. Cameron 
left Tuesday for a vacation in 
Truth or Consequences, New 
Mexico.

Local News
Mrs. W. W. Davis left Sunday 

for a visit in Waco, Texas with 
her daughter. Miss Mary Nan, 
a student in Baylor University,

Mrs. Gene Ross and Bill Ross, 
spent last week end in Colo­
rado Springs, Colorado, visiting 
Pvt. Gene Ross, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ernest Lovelace and family.

Mrs. Earl Kirkwood who un­
derwent surgery in Liberal, 
Kansas recently is recuperating 
and is now able to be out.

Jack Golladay and Charles 
Wisdom left Monday for Okla­
homa City, Oklahoma to attend 
a tractor school and dealers 
show.

Mrs. John H. Weeden of Ada, 
Oklahoma and son, Paul Weed­
en, and Mrs. Lou Brown of 
Guymon visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Ehrkwood and family Wed­
nesday afternoon of last week. 
Mrs. Weeden states that Mr, 
Weeden’s health has not im­
proved. He has been bedfast 
for several years. They now 
make their home in Ada, Okla­
homa with another daughter, 
Mrs. Cecil Ethridge.

Variety Club 
Entertained With 
Luncheon

Mrs. Jim O’Quin and Mrs. El­
mer O’Quin were hostesses to 
Variety Club members Thursday 
of last week with a covered dish 
luncheon.
, After a short business meeting, 

the afternoon was spent visit­
ing.

Those present were: Mrs. 
Ralph Keener, Mrs. J. W. Smith, 
Mrs. Tom Lavake, Mrs. Raymond 
Keener, Mrs. Dean O’Quin, Mrs. 
D. D. Howard, Mrs. Tommie 
Reeves, Mrs. Jim O’Quin and 
Mrs. Elmer O’Quin.

The next meeting will be

March 12 at 2:30 P. M. with 
Mrs. Sekki Lavake.

2843SIZES „ /

No. 2843 is cot In sizes 4, 6, 8 and 10. 
Size 8, 3%  yds. 35-in. For skirt and 
bolero. Contrasting top takes %  yd. 35-in.

No. 2758 is ont in small, medium, large 
and extra large sizes. Medium, 3 ^  yds. 
35-in. Edging, ZVz yds.

Send 30c for EACH pattern with name, 
address, style nnmber and size to 
AUDREY LANE BUREAU, Box 369, 
Madison Square Station, New York 10, 
N. Y . The new Spring-Summer Fashion 
Book shows scores of other styles, 25o 
extra.

The plant that produces corn- 
on-the-cob is a giant grass that has 
been found growing wild. Cultivated 
in South America since prehistoric 
times, it was one of the foun­
dations of the highly developed 
pre-Columbian civilization in the 
Americas. j-

Real dogs were models for 
sculptured likenesses of the Egyp­
tian god Anubis found guarding an­
cient tombs. This race of black 
dogs with delicate limbs, sharp 
muzzles and pointed ears has long 
been extinct.

The Stratford Star
Published W eekly By 

Brown Ross
M em ber Texas Press A ssociation

Entered as second class m atter at th* 
Post O ffice  in Stratford, Texas, undei 
the act o f  M arch 3. 1879.

Classified and Uegals
10 cents per line per Insertion; 7H 

cents per line subsequent jnsertlonf 
Display rates on application.

Snbscription Rates
$2.50 per year In Sherman and adjoin  

Ing counties. $3.00 per year outside 
first zone.

The advertisem ents have a message 
o f im portance for you.

Texaco i w i f i M

Pittsburgh

FILLBOND
Waterproof Concrete and Stucco Paint

Foxworth-Galbraith Lumber Co.

THE GENERAL ELECTRIC 
ALL-AUTOMATIC
WASHER

Here— in the G-E All- 
A utom atic—  is every­
th ing y o u ’ve a lw ays 

wanted in an automatic washer. 
You set the controls— the washer 
does a ll the work. C loth es are ! 
washed amazingly clean . .  . and sq  ̂
thoroughly damp-dried that man^ j 
pieces are ready for ironing.

G-E Activator Washing!
All the clothes are washed gently*] 
but thoroughly, with this correctly 
designed G-E Activator. It has three ' 
zones of washing action— gets out, 
all the dirt from heavy work clothes 
or delicate lingerie.

CJome in and see the G-E All-i 
Automatic Washer in action. A dem-i 
onstration will show you that it’S| 
“automatic washing at its finest.’* 

•Trade-mark Reg. U. S. Pat. PS»

Jones Hardware

See Admiral TV
With tbe New “ DX Super 53 Chassis

BEFORE Y O U  B U Y  A N Y  T V  SET

You Wilt Be Ready
\

WITH AN

Admiral
TV

McMahen Furniture Co.
When You Think O f T V  -T h in k  of McMahan’s
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Benjamin Harrison was the 
last U. S. President to wear a 
beard.

An intaglio is an engraving 
pressed below the surface of a 
material.

J o h n  D e e r e
ROTARY HOES

D e m p s t e r
HOES and DRILLSB en n ett Im plem ent Co.

A ttention  Farm ers
W e Stock a Full Supply of the Following 

Fertilizers in our Warehouse 

In Spearman, Texas

15-TON LOADS W ILL BE DELIVER­

ED to Any Part of this Area at 

REGULAR RETAIL PRICE

Pelletized
Fertilizers

10- 10-0
10- 20-0
14-14-0

Partially
Pelletized

10- 10-0
10- 20-0

0-20-0 Powdered Superphosphate 

0-45-0 Pelletized Superphosphate
(Available on Special Order)

33%  Ammonium Nitrate
(Very Limited Supply)

21%  Ammonium Sulphate

SEE OR CALL' US FOR YOUR  
FERTILIZER NEEDS

PHONE 2471

B&B Grain Co.
SPEARM AN, T E X A S

Public Auction
FRIDAY MARCH 13,1953

I  will sell at Public Auction at m y ranch located 7 miles East 
and 3 miles South o f TEXHOMA, OKLAHOMA, beginning prom pt- 

l ly  at 2:00 p.m., the follow ing m achinery:

1— 1948 Ford Pickup ^  ton.3— ̂ Model D John Deere tractors,
1941 Model, good shape.

4—  International W heat Drills
with packers, 1941 Model.

2— Two wheel wheat drill Hitches 

2— Dempster Drills, 1948 model.

2—  Graham  Hoeme Plows, 17 ft.

3—  15 ft. John Deere One Way 
Plows, 1947 model.

1— 10 ft. International Plow, 1947 
Model.

1— 10 ft. John Deere Plow, 1947 
Model.

1— Ann Arbor power Hay Bailer, 
’47 model.

1—^Attachable Bale Loader.

1̂— 10 ft. M cCorm ick-Deering 
Broadcast Binder, ’51 model.

1— 10 ft. M cCorm ick-Deering 
Broadcast Binder, 1948 M od­
el.

2—Ronning Ensilage Cutters, 
1943 Model.

2— 6-section John Deere Har­
rows and hitches, used one 
year.

2— 3-row John Deere Listers.

1—  5-R ow  Lister.

2—  Side Delivery Hay Rakes.

2— John Deere Manure Spread­
ers, 1948 Model.

1— 6-cylinder Hercules M otor 
Unit, com plete with clutch.

1— 12 ft. Truck Grain Box.

1— Tandum  Disk for Ford Trac­
tor.

1—  10 ft. Angel Plow.

2— 20 ft . Holt Combines, Junk.

1—4 Inch  Centrifugal Gould 
W ater Pump.1— 1946 1% ton  Chevrolet Truck.

Some knife sleds, and other articles too numerous to mention.

M. H. FREEMAN, OWNER
TERMS: Cash, unless other arrangements are m ade before sale. 

WHORTON BROS., AUCTONEERS

Hawaiian Statehood
Although there has been very 

little progress in the Congress as 
a whole toward completing fin­
al action on the legislative back­
log, the committees have been 
in almost continuous session for 
the past several weeks. One 
of the subcommittees of which 
I am a member has been hold­
ing the hearings on the bill that 
would admit Hawaii as a sister 
state. These committee meet­
ings have all been open to the 
public and many people from 
various walks nf life have shown 
a great deal of interest in this 
legislation. There was one 
group -at the meeting the other 
day that were not primarily in­
terested in the Hawaiian state­
hood, but were more interested 
in the mechanics of the United 
States Congress. These men 
came from Germany. The dele­
gation was from the legislative 
body of Western Germany. The 
delegation consisted of Hans 
Trossmann, Director of the Bun­
destag (Lower House), Albert A. 
Pfitzer, Director of the Bundes- 
rat (Upper House), and Freder- 
ich K. O. Schram, Assistant to 
the Speaker of the House. They 
found the proceedings most in­
teresting and informative. At 
the time of their visit there was 
extended debate in the subcom­
mittee concerning proposed a- 
mendments to the bill concern­
ing the constitution that has al­
ready been adopted by Hawaii. 
One point that was discussed at 
length was the possibility of a 
tidelands controversy should 
Hawaii be admitted to statehood. 
Incidentally, I warned the re­
presentatives of Hawaii to nail 
down their, boundaries so that 
there could be no question 
should they be admitted as a 
state. I called to their atten­
tion that Texas thought she had 
her boundaries fixed until some 
Federal bureaucrats decided 
they wanted the tidelands. Dur­
ing this discussion the former 
Attorney General of Hawaii, a 
Mr. Tavares, pointed out that 
there is practically no possibil­
ity of oil and gas along the 
shores of the Hawaiian Islands 
because of the fact that the is­
lands consist of volcanic ash and 
coral deposits. He pointed out 
that in the Islands television 
beams go through the moun­
tains, which of course indicates 
the lack of mineral desposits. 
It was also pointed out in the 
hearings that should the water 
area between the islands be 
used as constituting a part of 
the islands, Texas might lose 
her place as the biggest state in 
the Union. The former Attor­
ney General assured us that Ha­
waii would yield that position 
to the State of Texas.
The Tidelands

You of course realize that 
nothing yet has been done on 
the tidelands bills. This legis­
lation is presently before the 
Judiciary Committee of the 
House of Representatives and 
the Interior and Insular Affairs 
Committee in the Senate. 
Frankly, I think that these com­
mittee hearings are wasted time 
because this is an issue that has 
been more thoroughly scrutiniz­
ed than perhaps any other issue 
in the past two decades. Lengthy 
committee hearings have been 
had in both Houses of Congress 
and the reports are available for 
new members. The present ad­
ministration is committed to 
tidelands legislation, and I per­
sonally feel that no delay should 
be occasioned in returning the 
products of that attempted le­
galized theft to their respective 
states who rightfully own them. 
The new Secretary of Interior 
stated before my committee in 
the House that he was for re­
turning these tidelands to the 
States. He has recently been 
quoted in the newspapers to the 
effect that these tidelands 
should be returned to the States, 
but that all properties outside 
thereof should be decreed to be 
in the Federal Government, in­

dicating that the states border­
ing on the ocean should have 
no interest in the continental 
shelf. I believe that Secretary 
McKay was in some degree mis­
quoted in this statement as it is 
my understanding that he fav­
ored the bill that passed the 
House of Representatives last 
year. This bill not only quit­
claims the tidelands strips to 
the states, but goes into great 
detail to fix interests of those 
states in the continental shelf. 
This issue has caused quite a bit 
of comment here and has 
prompted some of the news col­
umnists to say that Texas and 
some of the other states now 
want to extend their boundar­
ies several miles farther to the 
seaward. This certainly is not 
the case. Texas has always 
asked for what was rightfully 
hers and is not trying to en­
croach upon anybody. She is 
trying to keep from being en­
croached upon. Incidentally, 
one of the leading newspapers 
in the East, the Washington 
Post, has carried several editor­
ials underwriting Federal own­
ership. Further delay in con­
sidering the matter could serve 
no good purpose and the bills 
should be brought to the Floor 
for an immediate vote.
Voice OJ America 

There are many people here in 
official Washington who have 
never been satisfied with the 
progress made by this arm of the 
State Department. In fact, 
many have constantly condemn­
ed it. The hearings in this 
Congress seem to be confirming 
a suspicion that I have long 
harbored, namely, that the 
voice is not that of America, but 
of some individual who makes 
a personal decision as to what 
Americanism is, or is not. This 
is certainly brought out in the 
discovery that certain passages 
from Edna Ferber’s book,, “The 
Giant,” were used in this broad­
cast. The excerpt reported to 
have been used on the Voice 
v/ere to the effect that male 
Texans drink bourbon by the 
gallon and that the women are 
all nitwits. Any book contain­
ing such a statement is a dis­
grace to America, and the 
broadcasting of such a statement 
on the Voice of America is am­
ple ground for abolishing the 
Voice altogether. My observa­
tion is that many people in this 
world could do themselves and 
their country a great service if 
they would follow the examples 
that have been set by Texans, 
especially those of our fine 
women.

BEVO SCORES . . . Clarence 
(Bevo) Francis of Rio Grande, 
Ohio, college basketball team, is 
breaking all-time national rec­
ords with his 50-point per game 
average, and a high game of 116. 
Bevo, a freshman, measures 6'9".

All in the Game:
Joe DiMaggio wil( have to wait 

a while before he is voted into 
baseball’s hall of fame. The for­
mer Yankee slugger was 81 votes 
short of that honor in the recent 
voting qf the Baseball Writers of 
America. Dizzy Dean, former St. 
Louis Cardinals ace, and A1 Sim­
mons, the Philadelphia Athletics’ 
one-time slugging star, were voted 
into the hall of fame. They make 
a total of 64 names enshrined in 
baseball’s Hall of Fame at Coopers- 
town, N. Y . . . . A news note of in­
terest about baseball and oil made 
the papers recently. Fourteen 
major league managers have in­
vested in oil well drilling in south 
Arkansas. Of three holes drilled, 
two have been dry. Doesn’t sound 
good for the coming season . • . 
The nation’s top scoring basketball 
ace isn’t a member of one of the 
big time temns voted each week 
as one of leading ten. He is Bevo 
Francis of little Rio Grande Col­
lege. He has been -breaking scoring 
records left and right all season.

India, with a population of 43 
million Moslems, is the third larg­
est Moslem coimtry in the; world. 
Indonesia and Pakistan are first 
and second, respectively.

Benzoquinone, from which sjm- 
thetic cortisone can be produced, 
is a derivative of bituminous coal.

Directions For 
Making A  Belt

Your belt is an important ac­
cessory to your costume, accord­
ing to Miss Lucile King, Home 
Demonstration Agent. If it is 
well made and the correct type 
for your figure proportions, it 
will add a professional touch to 
your costume.

What is the correct type?
The agent says if you are tall 

and slender yet well proportion­
ed, you may choose a wide belt 
of self or contrasting material. 
If you are thin and short you 
may choose a narrow belt of 
self or contrasting material. If 
you are short and stout you will 
want to wear a slightly narrow 
belt of self material.

Study your figure proportions 
and select the best type belt 
for you.

Recipe of the Week
Broiled Meal W ith 
Beef Patties

1 pound ground beef.
1 teaspoon salt.
Red and black pepper.
Small onion, grated.
6 slices bacon
1 can pineapple chunks 

Left Over Vegetables
Mix ground beef, salt, red and 

black pepper and onion. Shape 
into patties, wrapping each with 
a slice of bacon. Press pine­
apple chunks down into patties. 
Place on greased broiler rack, 
meat side up. Arrange left ov­
er vegetables such as green 
beans, mashed potatoes, peas, 
etc., in broiler pan. Place rack 
in broiler pan four inches from 
broiler. Broil until brown (8 
to 10 minutes) turn and broil 
until brown (8 to 10 minutes.)

, Two cups of diced, cooked tur­
key with a few other ingredients 
such as celery, mayonnaise or 
salad dressing and seasoned 
with salt, pepper and a little 
lemon juice will make enough 
salad to serve four to six per­
sons.

The agent suggests for variety 
using a half cup of slivered, 
toasted almonds just before

serving, or a half cup of diced 
avocado. If you prefer, serve 
the salad in avocado halves.

Cranberry sauce is a bright 
and tasty garnish for turkey 
salad.

To make a whole-meal-on-a- 
plate, add two cups of hard 
cooked eggs, two tablespoons 
chopped green pepper and a tea­
spoon of finely grated onion.

CARD OF THANKS
The Teen Age Square Dance 

Club wishes to thank everyone 
who helped make our Pie Sale 
such a huge success. We made 
$330.00 which will pay for our 
Public Address system and sup­
plies. We are grateful also to 
our Sponsors for their help and 
to Alfonso Garcia for his auc­
tioneering.

TEEN AGE WAGON WHEEL 
SQUARE DANCE CLUB.

Turkey Salad
The cooked turkey stored in 

your home freezer can be used 
attractively and tastefully for 
a salad.

Miss Lucile King, Home Dem­
onstration Agent, suggests tur­
key salad because it can be var­
ied in so many ways and is eas­
ily and quickly made.

WE HAVE
THE BEAUTIFUL NEW

Sparton

ON DISPLAY
1953 Sparton Cosmic Eye Television 

W ill Help You Get More For Your 

T V  Dollar!

Be sure to look for the extras that make for  more 
com fortable viewing. SPARTONS feature the Selector- 
Beam to show the channel you are receiving, instantly, and 
clearly.Stratfo rd  T racto r C o .

Your Authorized Sparton Dealer

Consumers Co,
A n n u a l  %9U  9 S I I C

Prices Good Until March 15th
OILS 55 Gallon 5 

Drums
Gallon
Cans

24 1-Qt. 
Case

DX-H D $42.35 $4.50 $5.35
DX-DHD $44.00 $4.65 $5.55
CO-OP PREMIUM $39.20 $5.25
CO-OP HD $42.35 $5.35
Shamrock Triple Action HD $44.45 $5.55
SHAM ROCK PENN $51.60 $6.35

Transmission And Gear Oils 5 Gallon 
Cans

D X  Brite Transmission Oil $11.70 $5.50
D X All Purpose Gear Oil $14.75 $6.60
Shamrock Green Gear Lube $13.80 $5.50
Shamrock All Purpose Hypoid $15.60 $7.00

GREASES 100 LBS. 40 LBS.

Shamrock Super fax No. 0 $13.30 $5.30
Shamrock Super fax No. 1 &  2 $13.00 $5.20
D X  No. 607 $13.90 $5.20 35 lbs.
CO-OP Multipurpose $16.50 $5.90 35 lbs.

All Prices Include The Containers
Credit o f $2.50 each will be given on a ll 55 gallon and 30 gallon drums in good

condition. It will be asked that all m erchandise bought on this price sheet be picked
up at the time o f purchase.

W e will accept orders on any item on th is list for  delivery when they com e in.
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Webb Is Returning 
To The States

KOBE, JAPAN — Cpl. Marvin 
L. Webb, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
William A. Webb of Sunray, has

left Camp Kobe for the United 
States and release from active 
duty.

Webb arrived in Japan in 
July 1950 and served as a mili­
tary policeman at Camp Kobe.

Wilson Funeral Directors
DIAL 2601

STRATFORD. T E X A S  

Any H our------Night or Day

DR. GUY D. CLAYTON
OPTOM ETRIST

APPOINTMENT NOT NECESSARY FOR OUT-OF-TOW N 
PATIENTS

FIRST NATIONAL BANK BUILDING

Dalhart, Texas

Y O U ’LL FIND

Crosley TV
AT W RIGH T DAVIS PONTIAC

All sets sold to any customer are backed by CROSLEY 
to be as good or better than any set made. You may 
try your new set out in  20 minutes. Aerial will raise to 

80 feet.

WRIGHT DAVIS PONTIAC

He entered the Army at Ama­
rillo in February 1950.

Two Things Make A Fine Salad
Fresh, crisp ingredients, 

and a perfectly blended dress­
ing. Here, our salad makings 
are bought fresh and served 
fresh. And our dressings are 
blended by the hand o f genius.

Palace Cafe
(Member Texas and National Restaurant .Association)

Gov. Shivers 
Proclaims 4-H 
Club Week

Governor Allan Shivers has 
proclaimed March 7-14 “4-H
Club Week” in Texas. The 
Governor placed the official seal 
on the proclamation signed in 
his office at a recent meeting 
with officials and leaders, to 
recognize 4-H club work being 
done in the state.

G. G. Gibson, director, Texas 
Agricultural Extension Service, 
says the group present for the 
signing include Floyd Lynch, 
State 4-H Club Leader and Er­
ma Wines, assistant; Rose Eris- 
man, Travis county home dem­
onstration agent, and Mrs. Ruth 
Mozzi, assistant; community 
leaders, David Ceders, and Mrs. 
Fred Buass, Oak Hill; and Del­
bert Taylor, Tarrant county and 
Dorothy Foltyn, Lamb county, 
co-chairman of the Texas 4-H 
Council, who presented the Gov­
ernor with an honorary 4-H club 
membership.

The proclamation reads:
“In recognition of the influ­

ence on our rural youth through 
4-H Clubs sponsored by the Tex­
as Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice in training aggressive and 
trustworthy citizens:

“And, the representation of 
youth in the organization num­
bering in excess of 117,000 Texas 
boys and girls cooperating with 
county agricultural and home 
demonstration agents, assisted 
by volunteer leaders, demon­
strating to others better meth­
ods of farming and homemak­
ing;

“And, the growth of their 
organization which found its 
beginning in corn clubs and to­
mato canning clubs, utilizing 
the teaching demonstration of 
which observance is made this 
fiftieth anniversary;

“THEREFORE, I, as Governor 
of the State of Texas, do hereby 
designate the week of March 
7-14 as 4-H CLUB WEEK in 
Texas, and urge all of our citi­
zens to participate in its obser­
vance.”

CARD OF THANKS
I wish to express my sincere 

appreciation to all my friends 
who have remembered me in 
any way during the time I was 
in the hospital and since I have 
been home.

Mrs. H. M. Brown

Women are not eligible 
Rhodes Scholarships..

for

F ord d oes it

Popular Recipe
'r\ON’T let stains mar your ta- 

ble linens for future use. 
There’s usually an easy way to rid 
them of stains if you use the right 
method. Here are some common 
stains and how to treat them.

Chocolate or cocoa stains on cot­
tons or linens should be dipped in 
hot water and then washed in rich 
suds. Bleach any remaining stain 
with hydrogen peroxide. For col­
ored fabrics, use lukewarm suds 
and sponge with carbon tetra­
chloride.

Coffee and tea stains on fine fab­
rics should first be sponged with 
warm water. Apply glycerine if the 
stain remains and let stand for 
half an hour. Rinse well then and 
wash in lukewarm sudsy water.

RECIPE OF THE WEEK 
Sausage-Spaghetti Sauce

(Serves 4-6)
1 pound bulk pork sausage 
1 4-ounce can mushrooms 
Vz clove garlic, minced 
1 medium onion, chopped 
Flour, salt, pepper 
3 cups tomato juice 
1 tablespoon Worcestershire 

sauce
Crumble and brown pork sau­

sage in skniet. Push to one side 
and remove all but 2 tablespoons 
fat from skillet. In this, brown 
mushrooms, add onion and gar­
lic. Blend in 3 tablespoons flour, 
add tomato juice and cook un­
til thickened. Add Worcester­
shire sauce, % teaspoon salt and 
% teaspoon pepper. Simmer 30 
minutes. In the meantime, cook 
7 to 8 ounces spaghetti in 3 
quarts boiling, salted water. 
When tender, drain and serve 
topped with sauce.

If egg or meat has marred your 
washable table linens, soak first in 
cold water, then wash in hot or 
lukewarm suds depending upon 
what the fabric can take. For 
non-washable materials, use car­
bon tetrachloride.

Grease stains should first be 
rubbed with soap, then washed in 
hot suds. If the stain remains, treat 
with a solvent like carbon tetra­
chloride.

Iron rust stains on cottons and 
linens respond usually to a soak­
ing in oxalic acid solution. When 
the stain disappears, place in a 
weak ammonia solution, then rinse 
thoroughly.

TALENT FOR GOODNESS
Some people have a talent for 

true goodness—like some have a 
talent for writing or painting. But 
they are few and far between.

A man with such a talent in the 
Bible was Barnabas, one of the 
leaders of the Christian church. 
Although he was known for his 
goodness, his greatest talent was 
finding goodness in persons that 
was not on the surface.

The truly good person performs 
his acts of kindness without a sec­
ond thought, without really realiz­
ing he is performing an exception­
al act. Barnabas was such a man.

The person who sets out to per­
form an act of kindness is not nec­
essarily a good person. He would 
never look for some act of kindness 
to perform if he were truly good. 
He can be classified as the imita­
tion-good persons.

But in every community there 
are those whose unselfishness, de­
votion to the Church and commu­
nity stamp them as truly good.

The man or woman who falls in 
this class can become a truly good 
person by continuing the pursuit 
of doing good until that pursuit is 
not secondary in their lives, but its 
guiding theme.
GO TO CHURCH THIS SUNDAY

Allison tuna, first described scien­
tifically in 1921, are no longer re­
garded as members of a distinct 
species. They are believed now 
to be large yellowfin tuna, which 
live in both Atlantic and Pacific 
oceans.

WMte sidewoE fires opfionol at extra cost. Equipment, 
accessories and trim svbiect to chonee wflhout notice.

A ^ in  FcHPd sets the trend! It’s the New Standard ■ 

of ihe Adnencan Road. Witib 41 "Worth More” featixEes , f 

woiih moce when yon buy it •. • wordi more vdien yoa deO dk 

WEib others were scampering to catch up, Ford again foirged 

fir in friHd; to brk^ you the greatest car l̂akie e¥€Se

See i^.e. Value Check i t , ,  •Test Drive it! 53 FORD

Stratford Motor Co.

CITATION BY PUBLICATION
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: Ed G. Sheldon, C. R. 
Thomas, Sarah J. Thomas, Bar­
ney M. Thomas. Lonnie J. 
Thomas, George S. App, Mar­
garet Gregory, Clara McKee, 
Frances Truog, Lloyd Noland, 
W. T. Noland, Thomas J. No-

Stop Taking  
Harsh Drugs for 

C onstipation
End Chronic Dosing! Regain Normal 
Regularity This All-Vegetable Way!
Taking harsh drugs for constipation 
can punish you brutally! Their cramps 
and griping disrupt normal bow el 
action, make you reel in need o f  re­
peated dosing.

When you occasionally feel consti­
pated, get gentle but sure relief. Take 
Dr. Caldwell’s Senna Laxative contained 
in Syrup Pepsin. It’s all-vegetable. N o 
salts, no harsh drugs. Dr. Caldwell’s 
contains an extract o f  Senna, oldest and 
one o f  the finest laxatives known
to medicine.

Dr. Caldwell’s Senna Laxative tastes 
good, acts mildly, brings thorough 
relief comfortably. Helps you get regu-] 
lar, ends chronic dosing. Even relieves 
stomach sourness that constipation 
often brings.

Try the new 251̂  size Dr. Caldwell’s. 
Money back if not satisfied. Mail botde 
to Box_280, New York 18, N. Y . ^

land, T. J. Noland and wife 
Effie Noland, Mary Alice Hut­
ton and husband John Hutton, 
Mary Alice Hatton and husband 
John Hatton, Truda McBride 
and husband E. A. McBride, 
Pearl Miles and husband W. H. 
Miles, Sheldon Foster, Rob Roy 
McAdams, Norvelle C. LaMar, 
Grester H. LaMar, Dana LaMar, 
A n n a  L a M a r ,
J. A. Kerr, Mrs. Zora Bennett, a 
feme sole, J. L. Blackwell, Oscar 
Blanton, Archie Blanton, Author 
Blanton, Nova Bagwell, C. J. 
Gaffney, J. W. Blanton, T. L. 
Lipscomb, T. D. Lipscomb, O. F. 
Loomis, Dave Alexander, I. H. 
Lamer, I. H. Lamar, C. R. Fos­
ter, J. P. Reeder, Arthur Lyle, 
E. G. Pendleton, Thos. Wake­
field, W. P. Wallace, J. R. Mc­
Adams, J. H. Blackwell, B. C. 
Lemons, the unknown husbands 
of any of the female defendants 
who may be married, the un­
known stockholders and direc­
tors of the First National Bank 
of Stratford, a dissolved corp­
oration, ]the unknown stockhold­
ers and directors of Farmers 
Mill and Elevator Company, a 
dissolved corporation, the un­
known heirs and legal represen­
tatives of any of the foregoing 
persons who may be deceased, 
together with their unknown 
heirs and legal representatives 
if deceased, DEFENDANTS, 
Greeting:

You are hereby commanded 
to appear by filing a written 
answer to the Plaintiff’s Petition 
at or before ten o’clock A. M. of 
the first Monday after the ex­
piration of forty-two days from 
the date of the issuance of this 
citation, same being Monday the 
30th day of March 1953, at or 
before ten o’clock A. M. before 
the Honorable District Court of 
Sherman County, Texas, at the 
Court House of said County in 
Stratford, Texas.

Said Plaintiff’s Petition was 
filed in said court, on the 9th 
day of February A. D. 1953, in 
this cause, numbered 1291 on 
the docket of said court, and 
styled, ERNEST LOVELACE 
Plaintiff, vs. all of the persons 
herein first above named De­
fendants.

A brief statement of the na­
ture of this suit is as follows, to 
wit:

Suit in Trespass to Try Title 
as to Lots Nos. 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10, 
in Block No. 83, in the town of 
Stratford, Sherman County, 
Texas, according to the map or 
plat of said town of Stratford, 
as the same appears of record 
in the Deed Records of Sherman 
County, Texas, and plaintiff 
pleads the 3 and 5 year stat­
utes of limitation, sets forth the 
claims of the defendants and 
prays for judgment for title and 
possession with writs of restitu­
tion and possession, removal of 
cloud, general and special relief 
in law and in equity, as is more 
fully shown by Plaintiff’s Peti­
tion on file in this suit.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the 
date of its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved.

The officer executing this pro­
cess shall promptly execute the

same according to law, and make 
due return as the law directs.

Issued and given under my 
h a n d  a n d  t h e
S e a l  of said Court, at 
office in Stratford, Texas, this 
the 9th day of FebruaiV A. D.

1953.
ATTEST:
(Seal)

LELAH BONEY 
Clerk, District Court, 
Sherman County, Texas. 

(Pub. 2—12, 19, 26; 3—5)Stratford  A b stra ct C o .
Minnie Laura Jackson, President

Incorporated 1907 ------  46 years o f Satisfactory Service to
Sherman County Land Owners

Let Us Make Your Abstracts
WE SHOW THE RECORDS

OFFICE IN AMERICAN LEGION BUILDING

TOP QUALITY MEATS
WHOLESALE For Lockers 

and Home Freezers
CUSTOM PROCESSING 

OF MEATS
Hams and Bacons Cored 

To Tantalize Tastes

Stratford Frozen Food Lockers

Dr. V. G. Martin
OPTOMETRIST

Dr. J. W. McCormick
OPTOMETRIST

DUMAS, TEXAS

605 Bliss Ave. Phone 2-4621

ABSTRACTS
W E H A V E  A  COMPLETE  

ABSTRACT PLANT
Covering All Real Estate In Sherman 

County
W e Furnish Quick, Efficient Service 

On Short Notice

Sherman County Abstract Co.
Roy«l Pendleton, Manager Stratford, Texas

The real bargain in cooking is electric cooking, 
for electric cooking is matchless seven ways 

and costs just seven cents a day.
The speed of electric cooking—all the heat 

goes into the cooking task, cutting down 
food shrinkage—added to the sootless, smokeless 

cleanliness you get only from electricity, 
brings you real homemaking economy.

Cook the matchless, modem way— 
of course, it’s electric.

O F  Q U A L IT Y

S O U T H W E S T E R N

PUBLIC SBBVICB
C O M P A N Y

28 YEARS OF GO O D  CITIZENSHIP AND PUBLIC SERVICE
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Philco
QLDSMOBILE

TELEVISION
FREEZERS

W I T H
1. Power Steering.
2. Power Brakes.
3. Power Body.
4. Power Rocket EngineCASE FARM TRACTORS

, G O O D YEAR  -  FIRESTONE  

H ARDW ARE

GUARANTEED SERVICE

Sloan Implement &  Auto

LOOK

TO

FOR

YOURWOOLSEY'S 
T V  Needs

W E H A V E  THE

Zenith
and EMERSON Lines

WE NOW HAVE A GOOD STOCK OF

REVERE WARE '
For Your Gift and Personal NeedsW oolsey A p p lian ces

DIAL 3431

THE COLORFUL

DECORATOR 
REFRIGERATOR

Exclusive with
INTERNATIONAL HARVESTER

Now you can change your refrigerator 
as often as you change your mind I

Decorate it in just 7 minutes with 1%  
yards of fabric to match curtains, drapes, 
or walls. You’ll agree it’s the most beauti­
ful refrigerator you can buy. Come in and 
see the new Decorator Refrigerator—now!

Two sizes: 8.5 cu. ft., $379.95
and 10 cu. ft., $449j9S

t o w  DOWN PAYM ENT-EASY TERMS

Celebrated 81st 
Birthday Saturday

Mrs. Charles Beck, a resident 
of Stratford in 1915, was hon­
ored with a birthday party Sat­
urday afternoon in the home of 
Mrs. J. R. Alexander of Gruver. 
Mrs. Beck is 81 years old. Mr. 
and Mrs. Beck moved to the 
Gruyer territory from Stratford 
in 1915 and have made their 
home at Gruver since that time.

Mr. Beck and two of their 
daughters, Mrs. Anna Thoms, 
and Mrs. Elizabeth McClellan, 
were present to enjoy the party.

Those from Stratford who at­
tended the party in the Alexan­
der home were: Mrs. H. L. Vin­
cent, Mrs. Hattie Flores, Mrs. 
Agnes Foster and Mrs. W. G. 
O’Brien.

Mrs. Beck received many nice 
gifts.

Refreshments of angel food 
cake, strawberries and whipped 
cream were served by the hos­
tess.

Methodist Revival 
Will Commence 
Sunday March 22

A Pre-Easter revival will open 
at the First Methodist Church 
Sunday, March 22, and continue 
for a week. Rev. O. B. Herring, 
pastor of the Methodist Church 
at Dumas will deliver the mes­
sages.

W.S.C.S. Ladies 
Have Inspirational 
Bible Study

The Womens Society of Chris­
tian Service met Wednesday af­
ternoon in the parlor of the 
Methodist Church for the Pre- 
Easter Bible Study.

The meeting was opened by 
singing the hymn “In Christ 
There Is No East Or West.” Mrs. 
Lorraine Mehner led in prayer.

“The Bible as a Symposium” 
' înd “Revelation Through His­
tory” was discussed by Mrs. 
James Cameron. Mrs. W. P. 
Cummings gave “God Visits The 
Earth In Great Crisis of His­
tory.” “The Exodus From 
Egypt” was discussed by Mrs. 
Vern Foreman. “Judgment and 
Solution” was discussed by Mrs. 
R. W. Standefer. “Hebrew Myth 
and History,” was discussed by 
Mrs. Harry Sears. Mrs. Lor­
raine Mehner then led the dis­
cussion of the lesson text, and 
read scripture from the 18th 
chapter of First Kings.

The worship center, arranged 
by Mrs. W. P. Cummings and 
Mrs. R. W. Standefer, Jr., was 
six red candles which represent­
ed the many Egyptian Gods, and 
a large white candle representing 
the'Hebrew God or Jehovah. 
These candles were arranged in 
front of a map of Bible lands. 
To make this scene more signifi­
cant, the red candles burned out 
during the meeting while the 
large white candle burned on.

Twenty-one members were 
present to enjoy this wonderful, 
inspiring meeting.

The assignment for next week 
is chapter 3 in the text “Toward 
Understanding the Bible.”

Mrs. F. B. Mullins dismissed 
the meeting with prayer.

King Equipment Co.

Ealon Norvell Circle 
Ladies Hold 
Bible Study

The Ealon Norvell Circle of 
the Baptist Womans Missionary 
Union met Wednesday afternoon 
in the home of Mrs. W. D. Ellis 
for Bible Study.

Mrs. Baskin Brown was in 
charge of the Bible study on the 
subject, “Women Who Knew 
Christ’s Healing.”

Mrs. W. D. Ellis made the op­
ening prayer.

Refreshments of cake and cof­
fee were served during the social 
hour.

Those present w*ere Mrs. Bas­
kin Brown, Mrs. E. E. Riggs, Mrs. 
J. P. Webb, Mrs. A. H. Ellison, 
Mrs. O. H. Ingham, Mrs. Leon 
Guthrie, Mrs. Newton James and 
Mrs. W. D. Ellis.

Teen-Agers Raise 
$330 For P.A.
System In Sale

Teen Age Wagon Wheel 
Square Dance Club members 
raised $330.00 with an auction 
pie sale held in Stratford Satur­
day afternoon. Sixty-three 
members of the organization 
had each pledged a pie for the 
sale. Alphonso Garcia auction­
ed the pies.

-A-gill i&-on€-eighth of a quartr

Australia was formerly called 
New Holland.

Local News
Mr. and Mrs. Keith Parrish, 

Palm Springs, California, arriv­
ed Friday for a short visit in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. L. C. 
Hurst. They left Sunday on a 
trip to Kentucky.

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Cum­
mings and Mr. and Mrs. B. A. 
Brewster attended the square 
dance at Cactus Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Judd left 
Thursday of last week for a 
visit in Truth or Consequences, 
New Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. Howard Glen 
Hart, San Diego, California, are 
here on a 30-day leave for a 
visit with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. E. R. McNeal. Hart has 
an ADAN rating with the U. S. 
Navy and expects to receive or­
ders for sea duty on his return 
to San Diego.

Mr. and Mrs. F. B. Mullins 
and Mrs. Lois Holmes spent last 
week end with Mr. and Mrs. 
W. L. Pendleton and children at 
La Veta, Colorado.

SEE HOW MUCH

MORE TRACTOR
YOU GET WITH THE

M

^•4

Stand if you won! lo. Th* new, 
high platform on the 3>4 plow MM 
Model UB gives the operator plenty 
of space for a  change of pace. 
Super>cemforloble FIole>Ride seot 
swings bock out of the w ay for 
maximum roominess.

M O D E L

CHIANG’S AID . . . Premier 
Chen Ching:, shown above, ranks 
number two in Nationalist 
China’s leadership, and is slated 

I to succeed Generalissimo Chiang 
Kai-Shek eventually.

Spark plugs must operate in 1,500 
degrees temperature, giving up to 
2,000 sparks a minute, and with­
standing explosive pressures as 
high as 500 pounds per square inch.

N E W  H IG H  in PROFIT POW ER...
Here's tomorrow’s tractor. . .  today! It’s the new, 3-4 plow 
MM Model UB that gives you more power on less fuel, more 
comfort, more safety, important advantages that make every 
hour in the field pay you bigger dividends than ever before.
THIS IS WHY THE NEW UB GIVES YOU MORE . . .
Nobody knows what a farmer needs as well as a farmer him­
self. That’s why Minneapolis-Moline went right out on the 
farm before building the new UB. MM asked farmers: 
“What makes a tractor best?” The answer these farmers gave 
are among the advantages you’ll find in the new MM UB 
Tractor. “Give us more power at lower cost . . . put the 
battery where it’s easier than ever to service, available live 
power take-off, a safe platform to stand on. Put shields around 
moving parts, give us sealed beam lights, complete brake con­
trol with one foot.” These and many more money-making 
features are all yours with the new UB.
See your MM dealer soon. Get the proof that this new MM 
UB Tractor is ahead of the field—that it‘s the right tractor 
for you!

CHECK THESE 
AT YOUR DEALERS
MORE POWER! •  NEW  FUEt 
ECONOM YI •  NEW HIGH  
PLATFORMt* NEW  IGNITIOM  
SYSTEM! •  NEW  STARTER! •  
NEW  CENTER LINE STEERING!
•  NEW  SAFETY FEATURES!
•  NEW PRESSURE CO O LIN G I
•  A U TO M A TIC  W EA T H ER  

C A P ! •  N E W  FL O T E -R ID E  
SEAT! •  NEW  FO O T CLUTCH!
•  NEW  BRAKE SYSTEM! •  

NEW  ROLLER DRAWBAR! •  
LIVE POWER TAKE-OFF! •  
NEW  FUEL FILTER! •  EXHAUST 
V A L V E  IN S E R T S ! •  N E W ,  
STRONGER •■BOSSES"!

S E E  YOUR  MIVI DEALER FOR ALL THE FACTS

ROTARY HOES Priced To Sell
J & B Implement Co

SIX USED V A N  BRUNT DRILLS FOR SALE

AT OUR STORE WE HAVE ONE BASIC AIM

All Popular BrandsCIGARETTES
Carton

(With a $10.00 Purchase or More)

i.4 9
300 SIZE WHITE SWAN WITH BACONBLACKEYED PEAS 3 FOR29c
HILLS BROS. ALL GRINDSCOFFEE POUND79c
WAPCO CUT 303 SIZEGREEN BEANS 2 FOR35c
PUFFINSBISCUITS SIX FOR49cMEATS
LEAN LOINPORK CHOPS POUND49c
ALL MEAT FRESHGROUND BEEF POUND25c
COUNTRY STYLEPUREPORKSAUSAGE POUND27c
LEAN 'SHORT RIBS POUND19c

TO  GIVE OUR CUSTOMERS THEMOST QUALITY FOOD
FOR THE M ONEY

ARMOUR’S CLOVER BLOOM

CHEESE
2 LB. LOAF79c

CONCHO 303 SIZE

TOMATOES
TWO FOR

2 9 c

ARMOUR’S STAR

LARD
3 LB. CARTON

3 9 c
SUN VALLEY Quartered—Colored 2 POUNDS

OLEOMARGARINE 35c
VEGETABLES

CALIFORNIA SUNKIST Medium Size 3 POUNDSORANGES 25c
FANCY LADY FINGERS

CARROTS
1 LB. CELLO. BAG12c

^RESH FIRM RIPE SLICERS ONE POUND

TOMATOES 23c
REDSPUDS 10 LB. BAG

3 5 c

Seamangrocery
BEST Q U A L IT Y BEST PRICE


