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Sadat hopes to join 
Carter-Begin talks

D R IW N  SANDS pushed by Friday’s high winds 
form  drifts in front o f the Fred Andrews residence 
in the 300 block of Godfrey. The National Weather

S erv ice  recorded wind gusts up to 69 miles per 
hour. Story elsewhere on this page. (Staff Photo by 
B ruce Partain)

Influx of military aid 
to Ethiopia reported
I b e  Waaklngtoa Poet

WASHINGTON — The Soviet Union 
and Cuba have more than doubled 
their military personnel in Ethiopia in 
the last three weeks in an apparent 
prelude to an Ethiopian counteroffen- 
^ v c  against Somali forces in the em­
battled Ogadtn region. U.S. sources 
said Friday.

The State Department voiced con­
cern Friday over a "substantial in­
crease”  in the number of Soviet and 
Cuban military advisers that has ac­
companied massive shipments of 
Soviet arms to Ethiopia.

A spokesman declined to give

!>recise estimates on the influx of 
oreign military except to note that 

the department had said earlier there

fa rm e r’s demands 
seem as basic as soil

Striking, boycotting, lobbying and 
the passage of pro-farm legislation all 
may help to ease the farmers' 
economic plight, which again has 
com e to the fore.

What these agriculturalists want is 
as bask as the soil they labor over. 
They would appreciate — even 
demand — a fair profit Without it. 
they're out of business. That's simple 
econom ks

And the one — the bask — segment 
of the economy which the nation 
plainly could not do without is that 
group of businessmen called farmers 
and ranchers.

Food and clothing are basic
Now, it's so very improbable that 

the nation's farm and ranch operators 
are going to fiull up stakes and move 
into the cHy. They’d starve, too.

The people and the government 
wouldn't allow agriculture to dk  out 
Perhaps tilling the soil is so basic that 
it's taken for granted by most.

What would happen should com­
mercial farming suddenly decline?

For one thing, ascending food and 
clothing prices would make the in­
flation of the past few years seem 
mild, even insignificant.

For another, victory gardens would 
be sprouting up In every other 
backyard. It Wbuld be another kind of 
war.

WMTHIR
Fair ioday through Sunday. Cooler

tonight and warmer Sunday. See
details on Page 2A.
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That's mere speculative rambling
What's real now is a battle some 

farmers and ranchers are waging 
with the politicians. They would like 
some favorable legislation that would 
make their line of work a paying 
proposition. Right now, H's not for 
many.

Politics aside, Midland County 
Agricultural Agent Charlie Green 
offers an alternative There's nothing 
new about it. It's the old principle of 
supply and demand

In the free enterprise system, 
prices go up when the demand is 
m a te r  than the supply. And prices go 
down when when supply is in surplus

"Therein is the crux of the farmers' 
problem — the surplus and their (the 
farm ers') inability to work together 
and store cotton," Green said of one 
segment of the farming economy.

Farmers would be wise to work 
through their cooperatives and to 
keep a surplus of cotton out of the 
marketplaces. They're not doing that, 
and cotton prices are not bringing 
farmers a profitable return.

What Green suggests has worked 
very well for the coffee and sugar 
magnates. They withheld calculated 
percentages of their products from 
the market, created a demand that 
outstripped the supply, and prices 
went rampant. Their riches grew.

Green, who's as honest as they 
come, isn't suggesting that farmers 
and ranchers become as cunning and 
conniving as greedy money changers 
and reap a quick fortune in a get-rich 
scheme.

Probably it wouldn't work.
He just wants to put some common 

sense to work for the agriculturalists.
“ What they want is not a rip-off.” 

Green said.
“ It boils down to' a basic poiitkal 

philosophy: You Want to get a n ir  
return for your labor and in­
vestment.”

And Green is proposing a Workable 
plan for thatf making that supply- 
and-demand principle work for the 
good of all. . . inthrlongrun.

The price farmers and ranchers are 
getting for their raw goods is lagging 
inflation in other sectors of the

were about 400 Cuban and 100 Soviet 
military advisers in Ethiopia a month 
ago

Privately, officials said more than 
1,000 Soviet and Cuban military per­
sonnel are currently in Ethiopia and 
that some of them are believWi to be 
with the Ethiopian troops in the 
Ogaden area, now largely in Somali 
hands.

.The influx of arms and personnel 
appears to reflect Moscow’s deter­
mination to shore up the embattled 
leftist Ethiopian government.

The Sovirt effort in Ethiopia has 
become a major issue in the current 
round of Soviet-American negotia­
tions on limiting arms sales to Third 
World countries, which began here 
this week

Earlkr this week. State Depart­
ment officials accused the Soviet 
Union of flying without permission 
over several countries in an effort to 
covertly  conduct its airlift of 
weapons.

The Soviet airlift, which started 
three weeks ago, reportedly involves 
unauthorised flights over a number of 
countries including Egypt, Pakistan, 
Turkey and Yugoslavia. It sup­
plements sea shipments of heavy 
equipm ent and also involves 
deliveries of Soviet-built MIG jets.

The Soviets are apparently pulling 
out all stops to resupply Ethiopia, 
replacing the long-time U.S. role as 
the key arms supplier.

By EDWARD CX)DY
CAIRO, Egypt (AP) — President 

Anwar Sadat said Friday that he may 
m eet Israeli Prim e M inister 
Menahem Begin and President Carter 
soon. But he said he was waiting for a 
message from Carter on the outcome 
of the American leader's talks with 
the Begin in Washington.

Carter telephoned Sadat on Friday 
night. White House spokesman Jody 
Powell said, and there could be fur­
ther communications between the 
two. But Powell said he knew of no 
plans for a Carter-Sadat meeting.

Sadat called a news conference for 
10a.m. (3:00a.m.ESTjSaturday.

Sadat’ s statement and the Begin- 
Carter meeting overshadow^ the 
preparatory peace conference here 
between Egypt and Israel. The 
m eeting, which recessed until 
Monday, is aimed a t . laying the 
groundwork for a full-scale peace 
conference in Geneva.

The Egyptian president, speaking 
after Friday prayers at a village 
mosque at Harraniya near the 
pyramids, said he might meet with 
Begin within two weeks, perhaps in 
Egypt. He said it also was poMible he 
would accept Carter's invitation to 
visit Washington, apparently to 
discuss proposals Begin submitted to 
the American president.

Sadat rejected a reported Israeli 
suggestion that residents of the oc­
cupied West Bank of the Jordan River 
decide their future in a pleblMite 
after 20 years.

“ But let us wait until we sec the 
outcome of th4 visit of Begin to 
President Carter and after that I shall 
be in a poaition to anawer whatever 
you ask," be told reporters

Begin met for two hours with Carter 
to outline "a  process for resolving the 
issue of Palestinian Arabs" and 
proposals for future Israel-Egypt 
relations, a White House statement 
said.

Sources said earlier that Israel was 
rethinking its position on the West 
B4nk and speculation, eentered on 
proposals for some locafWlf-rule for
the 650,000 Palestinian Arabs living 
there.

“ We discussed the most important 
p r o b l e m s  c o n c e r n i n g  th e  
peacemaking process in the Middle 
East," Begin said after he left the 
White House. Earlier, he told 
rep orters  there was a "rea l 
possibility" he would meet Sadat "in 
the very near future." But he said he 
could not say where or when.

The direct contacts and high-level 
exchanges returned the United States 
to a principal role in Midcast peace 
efforts. Washington’s position had 
diminished after Sadat's bold trip to 
Jerusalem on Nov. II which set off a 
series of fast-moving events.

Win(d-driven san<d (does 
little (damage in city

economy.
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By ED TODD

Sand and just plain dirt driven by 
winds that gusted up to 69 miles per 
hour crea t^  a day-long dust bowl 
Friday in Midland and in much of 
West Texas.

No major damage or injuries at­
tributed to the unusually high winds 
were reported.

However, some houses and trees in 
Midland were damaged, and some 
households and businesses throughout 
the city temporarily were without 
electrical power after fuses to seven 
transformers were blown out, said a 
spokesman for Texas Electric Service 
Co.

Some minor traffic mishaps were 
blamed on the high winds that 
cranked up about 7 a.m. Friday and 
finally died down 12 hours later.

The highest gust, 69 mph, was 
recorded at 11:57 a.m. at the National 
Weather Service at Midland Regional 
Air Terminal.

Throughout the day. the sustained 
wind s p ^  averaged between 35 and 
40 mph. said weatherman Richard 
WUson.

By 7 a.mj, the wind was gustinig up 
to 40 mph and more and by IW hours 
later, the whipping air was up to 50 
mph^ t

Commercial air traffic at the air-  ̂
port was virtually unaffected by the 
winds, said Ed Stevens, assistant 
chief o( the control tower.

Only one aircraft was delayed a few 
mlmitM because of the high gusts.
 ̂ And the prevailing westerly winds

Officials accompanying Secretary 
of State Cyrus R Vance on his six- 
country tour of the Middle East said 
Thursday that Israel was showing 
"new flexibility" in its approach to

the West Bank, which Sadat says 
must be returned to the Arabs as part 
of a complete Israeli withdrawal from

(Continued on Page 2A)

Budget trimmers 
challenge MX

WASHINGTON (AP) -  President 
C arter’ s budget trimmers are 
challenging the Pentagon's call for 
full development in the next fiscal 
year of a powerful intercontinental 
missile that would use a roving launch 
pad, according to administration 
source!.

Defense Secretary Harold Brown 
met with Carter Friday to dlacusi 
defense budget matters. It is un­
certain when the President will make 
his final decision on the fiscal 1971 
budget, due to go to Congress in 
January.

As things stand, the Pentagon is 
proposing military budget authority 
totalling up to about $129 billion for 
fiscal 1979 But the White House's 
Office of Management and Budget 
has been arguing for a limit of about 
$125 billion.

Regardless of the outcome, either 
figure would be a record and Carter is 
bound to be reminded of his 1979 
campaign pledge to cut defense 
spending by $5 billion to $7 billion.

Defense officials contend that even 
with the record totals in prospect, 
mostly because of Inflation, the 
Carter administration’ s new defense 
budget will be at least $7 billion or so 
below what former President Ford 
had projected for fiscal 1979 This, 
they say, would meet the Carter 
commitment

1 ^  moMl^ missile, or MX as it is 
known, is one of the more significant 
issues still unresolved in the Pentagon 
budget.

Administration sources say 0MB 
believes that full-Ksle development 
of what could be a critical U.S 
weapon of the future can safely be 
deferred for another year.

Carter already has delayed that 
stage of development once by trim­
ming the final Ford administration 
defense budget covering this 1979 
fiscal year

Brown reportedly has concluded 
that the next major step In develop­
ment should begin in fiscal 1979 even 
though some technical questions 
about the mobile concept remain 
Tests due to begin early next year are 
expected to provide answers to thooe 
questions.

Defense officials say they are 
concerned that a further delay in MX 
development would reduce the 
likelihood that the mobile miasUe 
could be ready for combat by the mid- 
1990s. That is when Soviet mlaaUe 
power is expected to reach a aise — 
even within the terms of a new 
nuclear arms limitation agreement — 
as to threaten possible deotnictioo of 
the fixed land launch bases of the 
present U.S. Minuteman missiles

There is also the feeling among 
Pentagon officials that proceeding 
with the development of the MX may 
help assure support by the joint chiefs 
of staff for a new SALT pact with 
Russia The military chiefs are 
reported to be uneasy about some of 
the tentative understandinn already 
reach ed  by U.S. and Soviet 
negotiators.

'The Pentagon has proposed alloting 
$245 million for MX development 
work in the 1979 fiscal year, which will 
start next Oct. 1. This is only a small 
fraction of the more than $30 billieo 
cost of a completed system of about 
300 multiple warhead missiles hidden 
in miles of underground concrete 
covered trenches and moved about 
periodically on rails.

Agencies join study 
of newest flu virus

were "pretty well aligned with the 
runway," he said.

"Fortunately, the wind was within a 
few degrees of runway two-eight," 
Stevens said. Some light airplanes 
were flying in the turbulence, he said.

Area towns, particularly those near 
broken farm lands, were literally 
showered by the blowing and drifting 
topsoil.

"It got pretty raunchy," Andrews 
County sheriff's dispatcher Mary 
Jennings said of the persistent winds, 
which may be a sign of cold gales to 
come.

Some signs, barbecue pits and tile 
fences were tumbled by the winds 
that gusted up to 65 mph at Andrews.

The dust was thick. The sun was 
"hidden" some.

“ It was one of those dust bowls." 
Mrs. Jennings said. “ It was pretty 
wicked."

In the Lamesa area, which is 
heavily into farming, the sky turned 
rusty red

"(It  was) like Kansas completely 
blew over,’ '  said Nova' Ray. a  
dispatcher. \

At Stant^, H was “ just dusty, 
windy. That's all I can say," said 
Martin County Deputy Sheriff Charles 
Sebastian. VUibUity was " t e ^ "  in 
spots, be said. ^

oixtpen miles north of Millland and 
on the Crouch Ranch, a small 
rangeland fire was caused by a 
downed powerliae. However, a fire 
engine from Midland put the blase 
out. ' ^

The Los Angeles Times

ATLANTA — An influents virus 
called a "distant cousin" of swine flu 
— reported mostly among children 
and young adults In 10 Soviet Union 
cities and Hong Kong — is being 
tested here by the U.S. Center for 
Disease Control and by a World 
Health Organisation office in London 
to avert a possible worldwide out­
break. the CDC reported Friday.

Dr. Walter Dowdle, director of the 
CDC Bureau of Laboratories virology 
division, said that there is "evidence 
that the virus is spreading" and that it 
could reach the United States "before 
too long.”

However, Dowdle deKribed the 
Soviet and Hong Kong outbreaks as 
"moderate”  and explained that the 
testing of specimens by the CDC and 
the WHO Collaborating Center for In- 
fluensa are merely precautionary at 
thisTOint.

" ‘fhe Soviet Union, through their 
good offices, let us know about it as 
soon as it happened ~  it’s for our 
benefit,”  Dowdle said in an Interview. 
"W e are now going through the 
preparations for making a vaccine. If 
a decision is made by our government 
to go ahead and produce one, we will 
be ready."

The tests began Wednesday, a

center spokesperson said, after the 
Soviet Union's minister of health had 
informed the World Health Organixa- 
tion on Dec. 7 that the inflnenia out­
break in his country was of 
"moderate clinical severity ’ ’

The tests arc being conducted 
routinely, the CDC explained, under a 
U.S.-Soviet agreement in effect for 
se v e ra l years, during which 
virologists of both countries have ex­
changed visits to discuss methods of 
isolating influensB strains and of 
making vaccine.

Flu viruses sre made up of particles 
of nucleric acid coated in proteins, 
and these particles constantly rear 
range the proteins to become new 
strains.

The principal virus being tested is 
called "A -R . Monmouth" — also 
known as "A-FM-1-47 (H IN D" and 
distantly related to the potentially 
fatal swine flu discovered la this coun­
try in January, 197$

It was exactly one year ago Friday 
that the federal government scrapped 
America's controversial $135 raillkm 
swine flu Immunitation program, 
(earing a possible link between the 
vaccine and a sometimes-deadly 
paralysis, Guillain-Barre syndrome.

Also being tested arc specimens 
isolated from the Soviet and Hong 
Kong outbreaks.
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WASHINGTON (A P ) ^  The 
Federal Enerty Regulatory Com- 
mUaion issued a coodhional cer­
tificate Friday allowing constnictioa 
to start on a natural gas pipeline to 
Mretcb nearly S.OOO milei from 
northern Alaska to the lower United 
States

Spokesman William Webb said the 
commission bypassed customary 
procedures in issuing the conditional 
certificate because it had no choice 
after Congress directed it lo authorize 
the pipeline

Webb said the Alcan Pipeline Co 
and its partners have not even sub­
mitted a formal application for a 
permanent certificate

He said the commission concluded, 
however, that h should issue a con­
ditional certificate allowing con­
struction to take place while it 
proceeds to consider the terms of a 
final certificate through its usual 
procedures

The commission had considered 
possible environmental impacts of the 
pro)ect when it was proposed in 
competition with other Alaska gas 
pipeline projects which have since 
b m  abandoned.
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Briscoe pushes carol
sing with 'challenge'

AUITIN, Tesss (AP) — Gov. Doiph 
Brincoe urged state employees 
FrMay to turn out for Christmas 
carols at the CapBoi neit Tuesday to 
answer the “ chaUenge'* of atheist 
Madalyn Murray O'Hatr 

"M y fellow state employoes. a 
chaUenge hat beou raised.. 

started a letter from Briscoe 
Press sserstary Bob lain  said the 

lottar was In response lo Mrs 
O'Halr's p l e ^  to confront em- 
plMreos at the Owistmas sing-song 

Mrs. O'Hair told a news conference 
at the Capital Tuaeday she had filed a 
B  mllMen suH ap tust the governor to 
ramuvs a nativity scene It m  the base 
of a huge Christmas tree in the 
CapBal rotunda.

It eras then. Bala said, that she 
m a d e  th e  co m m e n ts  abou t 
challenging the carol ceiebratlon 

‘*nda la. er ahonM be. a time of 
pegoe and fellewahlp among all 
peupM."  Briaene's letter aaid. "It is 
our light to gather peacefully, without

fear of dieruptlon. ia a lawful 
aaaembly

"There may be seme who would 
disagree but there is ao ncccaaity to 
be disagreeable."

" I  am coufidcot." Briscoe said, 
"that attendance at this year's 
Christmas Carol Hour will evidence 
overwhelmiag support for the right of 
frc« ciUtens to expreu through thetr 
preeence the high regard held for 
auch UradRioos

"I  hope you would )o1b me la la- 
vHlag others erho would like to share 
thia tradHhmal celebratloo

"This year'a Chriatmas Carol Hour 
could be considered a tribute to those 
who helped create a natton of free 
people and ensured that we can )oin 
together for the occasioo.

"I  am looking forward to meeting 
with you Tuesday "

Mri. O'Hair was on ths West Coast 
and unavailable for comment and it 
was not known if she would be back In 
Austin by Tuesday

LOVINGTON. N.M. (AP) -  A 
wind-whipped fire that destroyed 
severs! square miles of range land 
growth aouth of Lovington was under 
coutrol Friday afternoon, but Are 
fighters were battling two cotton gin 
fires In Uie tame area 

Fire officials said a blase at the 
Custom gin might have been started 
by the range fire, but that the fire a( 
t ^  second facility, the Lawrence gin. 
waa not. Both gins are north of Hobbs

Officlsls said they had been battling 
Uie Lawrence fire since late Thursday

range fire briefly threatened 
several homes in the area, but of­
ficials Friday afternoon had no 
reports of any bouses being burned 

Efforts to control the blase were 
hampered for several hours by winds 
guating up toBO miles per hour 

Fire o ^ ia l s  said about 20 cotton 
trailers at one of the two gin fires had 
been burned. Cotton was reported on 
Arc around Ute gin 

Fire fighters from Lovington. 
Hobbs. Eunice. MaIJimar and Tatum, 
which had battled the range Are 
earlier, were fighting the gins Ares 
Friday evening. They were joined by 
firemen from ^m lnole. Texas

Witness says Hughes 
interested in home

Sadat hopes
to join talks

(Cemtinued from Page lA )

HOUSTON (AP) -  A aaleapersoo 
for an expensive Houston deveiop- 
ment said a representative for the 
late Howard Hughes had inquired on 
New Year'a Eve af ItTS about spen­
ding tl.S million for three con­
dominiums as a ruaidence for the late 
recluae milUonairc.

Lillian White aaid she thowed the 
peothouae auite of the St. James 
Courts, on the outskirts of Houston, to 
Ray Tedrick. who identified himself 
as a repreaentative of Summa Corp 
and Howard Hughes 

As the Aral witness called by the 
state, Mt White said Tedrick was
especially interested "in security, 
privacprivacy and apace

"H e asked about the installatioa of 
an oiMaide ^ v a to r  so Mr Hulugbes
cuuM be brought la and out wttMut

p c ^ e  he represented."
The Texas trial of the vast estate, 

which hat been recessed until Jan. 3. 
la aimed primarily at proving the 
Houtton-bom Hughes always con­
sidered himself a resident of the state, 
despite the time be spent in Nevada. 
California, Boston sod in several 
foreign countries

At stake for Texas is at least $100 
million in inheritance taxes

The cate also Involves the validity 
of Uie ao-called Mormon will leA on a 
desk in the headquarters of the 
(Thurch of Jesus Clirist of Latter Day 
Sainu in Salt U k e  City. Utah

A similiar trial is now underway in 
Las Vegas, Nev.

Attorneys for Annette Gano 
Lummlt. M. and William LummU. 31.

occupied territory.
Begin previously said be never 

would relenquith the West Bank, 
captured from Jordan in the 1M7 war. 
because it is part of Israel He also 
haa rejected the idea of a sovereign 
Palestinian state in Uie area

Syria, prevkmaly Sadat's chief ally, 
has boycotted the Cairo conference 
because of this stand, charging the 
Egyptian leader srith the intention of 
aeUing out his breUieren for an 
Egypiian-Israeli deal.

Jordan, Lebanon, the Palestine 
Liberation Organization and the 
Soviet Union turned down in- 
vttttatlona to attend Uie meeUng. Only 
Israel, Egypt, the United States and 
the United Natkms are represented 
The Vatican hat tent an obaerver

I u o d
being Been Mr. Tednck said be was 
luoktef for I  Hottstaa home for Mr.\

are arguing that Hughes was a legal 
resident of Nevads. srherc tnerf is no

Hughes, ̂  Mw tesUAcd

"M r. Tedrick sleo inquried if • 
helkoutcr could Isnd on the roof ef 
our high-riee complex. We couldn't 
answer the questions without first 
ch ok in g  with the engineers srho built 

■Hue bolldtng He said to IM him know 
thd answers, but there was never arfollow up troul Mr ^cdrick er the

Inheritence taxes
Also entered into evidence Friday 

was a deposition from Mary Johnson, 
manager of Uw St. James Court 
ced that Hughes would purchase the 
three penthouse coodominiumt until 
"Uie Ume I beard of Mr. Hughes 
d ea th "

Hughes died In April 1171 while on a 
flight from Mealco to Houston for 
m ^ ica l treatment. )

At the United Nations, a spokesman 
for th«f PLO critkiied Carter's 
statement Thursday that the PLO had 
removed itself from any immediate 
partlcipaUan in a Middle East peace 
diaciuision by refusing to accept basic 
Secttrily Cduncil resolutions and 
acknowlndging Israel'a right to exist.

“ Carter iettcfylng intematiooal will 
and he‘ s trying to further obstruct the 

for a ^ sUnited Nations formula tor a peace 
conference.*’ said Zebdi LabibTeni. 
the FLO'S U.N obaerver. "Hd wants 
toimpooehlsownwUl"

1 (

TEMPTATION -fOPPORTUNin=CRIME

At least 2.BM Midund County 
reatdenu did not receive their new 
voter registration cards which were 
reeenUy mailed. Voter Registration 
D c j^ y  Janeke BuilU said Fridsy

cards, whidi become effective 
March I. were sent out recently by 
non-forwardable mail. Mrs Buiha 
said, aad at least 2.S00 have been 
returned to her ofAce by the U.S 
Poetal Service

Thoee who did not receive their 
cards need to act immedutely. she 
aaid. or they will be purged from tlie 
votizig rolla la January 

She said persons who have moved 
sin ce  they registered without 
notifying her ofAce can follow Uie 
instructions on their current blue 
registratioo cards la some cases, she 
said, rural route numbers have been 
changed, and those persons also need 
to Ale a change of address 

Other persons who did not receive 
r^iatrsUon cards siiould go to the tax 
o fw e  in Uie baiement ^  cour- 
tbouae or telephooe the tax office for 
aaatstance.

NEIGHBORHOOD COOPERATION can cut down 
(Ml house burglaries, a particular problem around 
Christmas. Midland police officials say. They urge 
citizens to get together with their neighbors and 
agree to report suspkioua persona, unmarked 
delivery trucks or any other unusual activity.

These precautions could help prevent the 2S per­
cent higher rate of burglaries normally reported in 
December, police say. A crime prevention seminar 
series, being organized by Midland Senior Citizens 
Against Crime, is scheduled to begin in March.

State official lauds
nursing home measure
By JIM STEINBERG

"The pauage of Senate Bill t 
markedly atrengUiened the ability of 
the Texas Department of Health to 
regulate nursing homes, including the 
closing of a home to alleviate an 
immediate threat to the health and 
safety of residenta," said Dr. 
Raymond T. Moore while in Midland 
Friday.

Moore a deputy commiaskmer of 
the state health department and in 
charge of the department'! Bureau of 
Long-Term Care, which administers 
the new law.

"The primary problem (before the 
new legialaUon was passed) was that 
the health department and the 
welfare department were given 
divided responsibility for nursing 
home care. "Now it'a been pinned 
down with us." Moore said.

The bill also "toughened up en­
forcem ent and provided legal 
protection for people in nursing 
homes All district attorneys have 
been given authority to foUow-up and 
investigate complaints." added State 
Senator Chet Brooks of Pasadena.

Brooks and Moore were in Midland 
Friday for Uie state's fifth ptfbHc 
hearing by the Senate Human 
Resources Committee, on the ef- 
fecUvenets of Uie legislation to date 
Brooks is chairman of that com­
mittee.

"The hearings are a chance to aee if 
there arc any weaknesses in the 
leg is la tion ," said Brooks, who 
authored the bill

line ofl Oct. B, more than 144 com­
plaints have been received. But 
more than twice that number of calls 
have been received on the line, in­
cluding favorable comments concer­
ning nursing homes. Moore said

said.

There are three levels of infractions 
that can result from Uie detailed 
surveying process that involves 1.000 
items least serious is a com­
pliance or probationary notice. Moore 
said Thia can be over a matter as 
simple as administrative paperwork.

Infractions of a slighUy more 
•erious nature can result in a 
recommendation for a vendor hold, 
meaning a cut-off of all state and 
federal funds until the situation is 
corrected.

A more serious level, however, is a 
recommendation for decertificatioa 
or denial of certification statiu The 
most serious infractions call for a 
hearing for license revocation. Moore

As of Dec. 9. there were seven 
nursing homes in Texas listed as 
"presently on decertification or 
denial of certifkation status.”  They 
included the Leisure Lodge of 
Midland and the Leisure Lodge of 
Lamesa.

Among 14 facilities listed on 
"recommended vendor hold status" 
was Deerings Nursing Center in 
Odessa.

There are approximately 80.000 
people in Texas living in nursing 
homes licensed by the department of 
health, Moore said.

Between July 1 and Dec. 9 of this 
year the department has issued 331 
compliance or probationary notices, 
issued 102 recommendations of 
vendor hold, issued 38 denials of 
certification and scheduled three 
hearings for Ikeneure revocations. 
Seven cases of alleged abuse to Uie 
appropriate district attorney, Moore 
said.

'Moonies' win court round

"Before the passage of SB 9. abuse 
of an elderly person In a nursing borne 
was not a crime under Texas statutes 
What the legislation did was extend 
the philosophy of the child abuse laws 
to t ^  elderly, who are in many cases 
as helpless as the children the old 
laws provided protection for," Brooks 
said

LUBBOCK. Texas (AP) -  A 
federal Judge temporarily blocked the 
City of Lubbock on Friday from en­
forcing Ha aolicHaUon ordinance 
against members of Rev Sun Myung 
Moon's Unifkation (Thurch 

Members of the church, known as 
"M ooniet." asked U S District Judge 
Halbert Woodward for the order to 
prevent the cHy from arresting them 
for seeking money without a permit 
required by the ordinance 

In granting the temporary in­
junction. Judge Woodward agreed 
srith the Moonies' claim that the or­
dinance is too vague and that tt 
violates First Amendment rights of 
free speech and religious freedom 

The judge said the language of the 
ordinance it not specific enough in

setting standards for permit Issuance 
because it gives too much discretion 
to the city secretary, the Ikensing 
offker.

Tbg injunction is temporary, he 
said, but will remain In eAect pending 
a hearing on Uie issue or uiHil Uie cHy 
amends its ordinance to meet his 
criteria.

In a preu  conference last week, 
members of the church u id  Lubbock 
was to be the Aral of several Texas 
cities where they will test soUettation 
ordinances

They said their permH applications 
had been tablid twice on the 
recom m endation of the Better 
Business Bureau because they 
w ouldn't provide financial in­
formation about the church.

Because of a terrifk number of 
complaints about the treatment of 
persons in nursing homes and a 
number of what Brooks called 
"questionable deaths" in nursing 
homes, the Texas Legislature went 
Into special sessioa in July to pass the 
act. It went into effect on Oct 1.

Pretty Boys departure 
comes at a bad time

"A s a means of providing a realistk 
impression of the level of care given 
in nursing home facilities, Uie act 
provides that surprise inspections 
shall be made. The (health) depart­
ment has instituted a schedule of 
unannounced inspections — outside of 
normal department working hours — 
and will continue this praetke as the 
situations warrant. Some of our in­
spections are being made at night and 
on Sunday mornings." Moore said.

"T o better meet Uie needs of the 
public and make complaint reporting 
easier, the department has installed a 
toll-free telephone number, that is 
manned during working hours, and 
srill record calls at other times." 
Moore u id .

But before using the to register a 
complaint. Moore strongly urges 
people to talk to Uie administrator ̂  a 
nursing home first.

The number is 1-B0O-252-910B 
Since the installation of the toll free

DEATHS

Alta Kaderli
FREDElftCKSBURG -  Servi(fes 

for Alta Barker Kaderli. 72. siskr of 
Mrs Marie Mathes of'Crane. will b .̂ 
at 10 a m. today in the Schaetter 
Funkral Home with burial in . ^
Conlfort Cemeterjr 

Mrs.i Mrs. Kkderii died Thursday.
She was bom April 17. 190S. in 

Mason County. ShA married Arthur 
Kaderli March 3. IME, in San Antonio.

Other lu rv iv ori include her 
husband, a daughter, six grand­
c h i ld r e n  [a n d  th r e e  g r e a t ­
grandchildren.

Kenneth Guthrie is appealing to the 
public on his 92-year-oM mother's 
behalf in order to find Pretty Boy in 
time for diristmas

Pretty Boy, Lula Guthrie's dog, 
disappeared from the Kenneth 
Guthrie backyard in Uie 3700 block of 
Monty Drive over a week ago. Guthrie 
was keeping the dog for his mother 
while she attended Um funeral of a son 
inCaltforaia.

“ This is of grave importance to me 
and my mother.”  Guthrie u id  "She's 
92 and lives alone — at least she lives 
alone now.

"She just buried a son and returned 
to find Pretty Boy miuing It’s almost 
Uke having another ton missing," he 
u id .

Guthrie u id  Pretty Boy resembled 
a small Doberman Pincer He it black 
with tan markings on hit body, it 
about a foot tall, hat short hair and a 
bobbed tail. Pretty Boy also has a 
white mark about half the size of a 
thumbnail on each foot. Guthrie said.

"He had a flea collar with a tag on 
H, but all the tag had on H was the 
veterinarian's name in Anson, where 
my mother lives.

“ What makes H udder on my part 
is that my mother hat a sister in 
Anson who was going to keep the dog. 
But she lives out in the country near a 
highway, and I taisisted that it would 
be better that I keep him because I 
bad a fenced yard. I was afraid that 
he would try to go home and get lost 
or hurt on the highway."^he eaid.

"Around (Thristmat. I know there 
are a lot of appeals, but I’m not asking 
for food or money or anything like 
that. I'm just appealing to someone if 
they have the dog to return H.

“ There’ s no way he could'' be 
replaced. This dog was everything in 
the world to her. I’m sure she won’t 
give up on /getting him back for 
months. ,

" I ’ ve t^lM everything, including

adt. I've had a couple of people call 
me. One lady said she u w  a dog 
matching Uie description, and he 
responded to the name Pretty Boy. 
But she couldn't get him to come to 
her.

"She said the went right home and 
called me at work, but by the time I 
got there he was gone

"Since he’s not familiar with the 
town, there'! no way he could find his 
way home lo Anson — that’ s ISO 
m iles," Guthrie said.

Pretty Boy joined Die Guthrie 
family when Kenneth Guthrie rescued 
the puppy from a highway median.

" I  lived with my mother. He just 
more or lest became her dog When I 
leA, I leA the dog because he had 
become to attached to her and she to 
him. He slept beside her bed. and if 
she went into the living room, he went 
and laid down betide her chair," he 
said.

" I ’ve looked every spare minute I 
have had. 1 Just can’t And him."

Guthrie said anyone who saw 
Pretty Boy could call him at work. 
SB3-2422. or at home. B94-B187.
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Beef packers yield to farmers /A

PLAINVIEW. Texas (A F > - A West Texas beef 
packiag pUat. yiekUng to striking farmers' 
demands fo r  a siMStdown o f  the facility agreed Fri­
day to h f8-bo«r halt of moot meat shipments 

The agreement, hammered o«t in all-night 
negotiation at the MBPXL plant here, came after 
the company had sought and received a temporary 
restraining order barring striking farmers from 
blocking tmeks carrying perishable meat 

The action came as the nationwide farmers' strike, 
called to protest low farm prices, entered its third 
day

Greg Rystad. spokesman for the farmers, said the

company agreed to ask that the court order be lifted 
in return for promises that the pickHers would allow 
13 trucks carrying 8230.000 worth of meat be allowed 
to leave the plant

A statement issued by MBPXL said 
"It is regretable that a request for a restraining 

order was made but the company felt such action 
was necessar)’ due to the perishable nature ofthe 
fresh meat and until formal negoUatioas could take 
place for disposition of the perishable product ”

The 48-hour shutdown agreed to was retroactive to 
2p.m Thursday

"W e're tired and happy." Rystad said "We

Lo-Vaca letter warns customers 
not to expect lower gas costs

THE PERFECT CHRISTMAS PRESENT, case No. 751, p o « i .  
com plete with a bow under the Christmas tree. The long-haired, 
10-week-old female the Prevention of Cruelty to Animals shelter 
at 5101 Andrews Highway. The shelter is open from 10 a.m. to 4 
p.m . Monday through Saturday. (Staff Photo)

THERAPEUTIC HYPNOSIS OE AMERICA

Lose WeiEht •  Stop Smoking
for frM 8rock«rt Call

_________563-3060 or 333-4472________ __
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Midland
pair
burned

Sid Wilson. 21. and Kim 
Armstead, 22. were listed 
in satisfactory condition 
at Midland Memorial 
Hospital Friday night 
with first and second 
degree bums 

Wilson and Armstead 
were injured when a 
heater in the kitchen of 
their trailer house at 
C l o v e r d a l e  a n d  
Fairgrounds roads ex­
ploded as the two men 
tried to light H.

The fire occurred about 
12:30 p.m Friday 

Wilion and Armstead 
were taken to Midland 
Memorial by private 
vehicle Wllaon suffered 
bums to both hands and 
his fa c e . Arm stead 
received acute lecond- 
degree bums on his lower 
face and first-degree 
bums on his hands, a 
ip o k e a m a n  fo r  the 
hospital said 

The tra iler houie, 
which had been pur­
chased new by the two 
men last week, received 
heavy damage during the 
fire.

S H U

Two sale garments for the price of higtier-priced oie

or
ON
INDIVIDUAL 
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Selected merchandise now on sole Slocks, blouses, shells, jackets, 
dresses-long and short, pantsuits.

I THRtE DAYS ONLY 
tNURSDAT, FRIDAY, SAYURDAYf
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HOUSTON <AP) -  Lo-Vaca Co has notified all of 
Hs customers it would be unrealistic for them to 
think their natural gas bills will be lower in the 
future.

William E Greehey, president, made the ob- 
aervatioo in a letter sent to all Lo-Vaca customers 
after the Texas Railroad Commission on Monday 
ordered Lo-Vaca to return to original contract rates 
and refund about $1 billion collected since the 
commiaskm approved an interim rate reflecting 
h u ^ r  supply coats in 1873 

l lie  letter was dated Thursday and copies were 
released Friday

"I f  we were forced to sell gas at the old contract 
rates, we would be sustaining losses of over a million 
dollars a day,”  Greehey said 

“ We would not have the ability to pay our 
producers, and they would of course discontinue 
selling us gas.”

Greehey criticized a portion of the new order 
stating that producers may not withdraw their gas 
from the Lo-Vaca system 

"This is a nebulous position and it legally unen­
forceable unless the producers are receiving timely

Shipping rate 
could deter 
city's coal use

SAN ANTONIO. Texas (AP) -  A hike in the 
freight rate for shipping coal to San Antonio could 
leave the city paying more for r ^  than it spends for 
gas to generate elertricHy, officinls aay 

A spokesman for the municipally-owned City 
Public Service utility tayt CPS will use every legal 
means available to prevent an increase pending 
before the federal Interstate Commerce Com­
mission

"The whole concept of fuel conversion (from oil 
and gaa to coal) is threatened by runaway tran­
sportation coats," U S Rep Henry B Gonzalez said 
late this week

Burlington Northern railroad. CPS' coal tran- 
aporter, filed a request with the K T  thii week for a 30 
per cent hike in freight rates to San Antonio 

The present rate for shipping the coal from 
W yom i^  to San Antonio is 111 84 per ton Burlington 
Nortbem is aMiing for 818.23 The ICC recently 
award the railroads 813 80 a ton for coal shipped 
from Wyoming to Houston.

Jack Spruce. CPS general manager, said If a rate 
equivalem to the new Houston charge is approved for 
San Antonio, the increaae would offset the gains 
rcali|g(Pi(rom using coal instead of natural gat to 
prodm^dbrne of the uUlity't electricity 

If the tame rate basis were used for San Antonio at 
for Houston. Spruce said, the local coat would jump 
from 811 84 per ton to 813.82 and would cost CPS and 
Hs customers an additional 812 million a year 

Gonzalez met with Carter administration officiali 
this week and told them the highef ICCapproved 
rates could wreck the president's energy program be 
ending the incentive to bum coal instead of natural 
ga i in many parts of the country

Robbery 
charged

C h a r l e s  B u r n i a  
Robinson Jr.. 2R was 
arrested and charged 
with aggravated robbery 
at about noon Friday, in 
connectloo with the ar­
med robbery of a Midland 
c o n v e n i e n c e  s to r e  
Thuriday afternoon

Peace Justice John 
Biggs set bond at 823.000 
F r i d a y  a f t e r n o o n .
Robinson was in cHy jail 
Friday.

According to police, 
two men entered the 
Speedway Food Store in 
the 2800 Mock of North 
Big Spring Street at about 
2 p.m. Thuriday

Coughran Ketner. who 
was working in the store 
at the time of the rob­
bery, told police that two 
men in their late teens or 
early twenties entered 
the store, pulled a .38- 
ca lib er revolver and 
demanded money.

Ketner said the two 
then tied his hands wHh 
an electrical cord they 
brought with them and 
fled on foot Ketner freed 
his hands and called 
police

Police Thursday night 
arrested and charged 
Lewis Montgomery, If. 
with aggravated n A ^ ry  
in connection wHh the 
Speqdway Pood Store 
robbery.

Detective Capt. Billy 
Ray said potice received 
information that Mon­
tgomery and Robinaon. 
iibo  are half-brothen. 
were together all day 
Thursday. >

Robinaon waa arrested 
when be came into the 
police department to vtait 
Montgomery. Ray Mid.

i

paym ent," Greehey laid
"I  was extremely surprised that the commission 

misled our customers into believing we had an 
adequate long-term future gas supply and that our 
producers would be forced to produce their wells 
even if they were not paid "

Greehey said he must emphasize that if Lo-Vaca 
were in receivership with a trustee appointed by a 
court to manage the company the truitee's primary 
duty would be to satisfy the interests of creditors 
rather than customers

"O f course, the major creditors would be our gaa 
suppliers.”  he said. "The customers would be the 
last of his priorities "

Greehey said moat of LoVaca'a major customers 
have a g r ^  in principle to a proposed out-of-court 
settlement of some 81 4 billion in lawsuits filed 
against the company

" .. we in Lo-Vaca would strongly urge all of you to 
lend whatever support and leadership you ran to help 
see this plan come to fruition," he said

“ In the meantime, I would solicit your help to 
ensure that all customers continue to pay the Interim 
rate on a timely basis so we can in turn pay our 
producers on time "

Greehey said “ It should be readily apparent to 
everyone that we are confronted with an Impossible 
situation."

"Both you (he customers and we the court- 
appointed management are similarly situated in this 
rather precarious position that cries for a solution 
that addresses the public interest." he said

woo.
A caravan of tractors rolled toward this Wtai 

Texas city early Friday morning. Rjrstad Mid.
MBPXL corporatt officialafrom  WIchRa. Kan., 

flew in for Friday morning session 
A committee of four farmers talked with company 

officials Rystad Mid at 2:30 a m the committee 
cam e out of the meeting and a aecond commNtM, 
made up of 18 farmers from various areas, weot ta to 
complete the negotiations 

"The farmers agreed we would let the selected 
loads of beef go and we would retire from the picket 
lines at the end of a 48-hour period. We have left a 
token force there," Rystad Mid Friday afternoon 

The agreement alao Included a MBPXL promiat to 
write letters to government officials expressing their 
support for the plight of the farmers 

Rystad credits the roadweary farmers who drove 
their tractors here during the night for the succeu 

"When only 20 or 30 showed up they felt we weren't 
serious When they realtzed others were on Iheb' way 
they knew we were serious." he Mid “ It was an 
Impreuive sight"

Rystad Mid the farmers were planning to go home 
and rest Saturday

"W e're rookies at this We need to reflect on what 
has happened and what we have accomplished," be 
said

Rystad refuted to comment on "phase two" of (he 
farm strike He had previously Mid It would Included 
more “ militant" actions, but no violence.
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QUASAR 29 1 RM KS M  A  O fM W iR * COLOR TV«W°"d
• 100% SaM SIM* aantMtonar OiaMW mati Stow Media* • 
a>M*r Mat* MMf  Cato TiawiB'Uda* laaa *na>eyeiantM>eo*ae 

biab* • Two aea i'

\

• F«eo raoan wtoi tnto* aMtodheard and 
uMled weed pert* • Caear* .
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Church Calendar A.

WOli-PIUOtlW ATIOWAl. Ouktova Part BapttM
■SfifTST^

Mt
aiB ruvH 
■ot •  ■  l « i  » »  h U M ••

CkurchofCkriat.
Gardmdalc

^  r y '

r « » a  C«

> M # • ITV
« » » •  Cm m

»  a  » a  ~

TaOCltirlapttutCkwck N «« Bop* Baptiut

— • * ttupa
i f  » « • •u

t * » a

rL'paWMLPMa
t  S  • ■  taatef I 

II «  • a  > a «a |  
» a » a  I MIW I 
« M » a  C M M f

• ■ » a  K M a g M r a a

ClrarekafCliriit.Miia
StrMt
rwwm  H a *  Ha* m i B a t a  ta «

PR IN TIN G
313 W. M a  

O4-H0I
A. 0 .  “IfeM t"

W a  l a
t  a  ^ a

a  a  « a  
n  a  « a  
t a  * a

N«V I'MUU
C W ch
K X S t t i r n m

l*Ot

BAPntT-AOUTHEltN
h Mar — 
gIMt AIm m  HciglMi BipUft

N *« J«r«Ml*Ui Biptltt 
laiB CmUmU ■a Aa*r cweas rmm  

» a  I a  !«■<•> a lM  
u  a  » a  l a

Chwck of ChriA. Mldklff f %  !|
I •  »  •  TrtiMg Vmm
f t»pm wrikip

• M b s  
I* »  B •  
$m  pm

lU aC karchif B * I h i* w  B i p t k l  
ta iB  m ttm tm rn  _

lA  a
aa ia rvO a M k a  a*taAM«F 
a t  a *  r a a ia  a  a> u a > '

» a  t a  
a  a  « a  
I a  » a  
* a  » a

P*opl*'B ProUiUat If U- 
■loMnr Biptlft Ckarch 
ta iB  ( p n a a
■ a  L L  M a«A f M a  

* B » a  la a t t a A a l  
II a  • a  lk n a «  w r a a  
« a » a  B a a ^ n r a a

Cirarch of Christ. 
Sid*
mu Laws lea

North f e a i r . j ^ S f c

1
FbBp Wmmw*

1 CITK 6IL[Ku i cAimsLaah i

> BMM6
B RAftASiM CAtoft 

3 4it4M iiiMwy 
hB3Xm

• a « a  
a a  * a  
(  a » a i t j s r s ;

Church of Christ. Spsniih
Priatthr* Baptist
«u«

SuIvsUsa Anuy 
j y  iaaeta

•a

Cshrsrp BsptiK
a a t  a e a a

a  a  • a  
* a  » a

a  • a  rkerrA akea 
U a  « a  He 
t a  »  a  B«

West Sid* Prut WUl 
Baptist

Church of Christ. 
Westsid*

t o m m y  HAMM

Balie Giiffitt)

jMW WM, OeleeeA Mae

/I 1 \
*  a T I r 'h a A e t t r ia a m AMat

ADV P m ST 
S*v*ath Dsf Adv*atist

Cottoa Plat Baptist
let le a > tra t  f e a  a a t a  %mmmri 
u  a  e a  »mmm  
(  a  » a  Ttaeat 
f a » a  Bteaeg

‘ l i i ; :  ^ " ^ w t  c ^ i : « u 7 ^ D

a a t a
I a  A *
< a  » B

y«aaa<EttMat

Cruitvtsa Baptist

* a  »  a  E ««a a  M nka

CATHOUC
Our Lady of Guadalupe

Aiezaader Tempt* 
Church of God in Christ
R ^ T O W . a a

• U • a  ieeAtt wMe

Vrt cml> a lew had hern striK-k!

Sucx'TM It not timpl> r e a h in i  one 't aim A bowler knows how nuK'h 
depends on the ri({ht "action" once the hall hits that first pin

NfED EXTRA CASH?
>11 your "DON ’T NfED' 
ifenis with 0—

WANT AO!
Dial 682-6222

APOSTOLIC
Pint Apestsik Church
f a t  s a a i i

f  «• BS
urn $m 
%mpm  
f  m pm

Csthoik
a a i  TttarH
Set ChetSa 
M ta

EeeAet Mue

0 ■ I

■ aB ftaw l BapUil
«  tPf.^MMP tatepacM

mm^rn
\%m%m

M t  CftvfyUfli 
• BAB»  twBBftl •

IglsWs Apostoitca 
Ds Ls Pc K b  Crista lesui

t a a a  rra a a g O a a  
t a » a  Eteeaa i iAs

S a M a t  I a j a
Dell H ta  r M e a  i f  

Aet a ia ttia  
fmthmmm « a  a a  

A U f  a  eeeAAttt

of the
la a A tt

a * i  n  U M an
let v a a e a  • Tett« 
a a t a  l a A i n  Aapa Ete^

PsuaiB TerrM* Baptist

Nets BetluBy ApostoUc 
Church 
UIE a a f i E U  
ra iM B  B Beketa

t a i a  SeMetttAeU 
l i a t a  U eta etM ta a  t a » ^  irnmmmtm

• a  e a  IwMeti 
II a  * a  U a n i  
t a p a  Bteeea

Our Lsdy of Ssu Juan 
Chspei

PIrstBsptist
8r*BMM«rv«£ 1 • a ta

MiV HbW ACPBBf tl
Hbbb • » b a  •%frnmt 

Cm^Mamm Walapf Hbbb 
DWMB tm  pm  TbbbBbp I 

WBOBBi By

• M b s  taiBpBBWBBf 
11 •  B a  H a M  wwia t^pwr- rxaH vw

St. AU*tC«thohc
MW Hti

n »  B _ _
• M ^ a  Y«w^ 
tm p rn

ChortliolGod
... _____ Oilif< * ftar Oiap W

Ba ‘
II »  B a
i m p m  Ewmtmwm

Church of God 
Seventh Dsy
BACCewAeaM

a a t a  Settetkateel 
I M o b  BpBBMfaphirf

church of God of Union
Assembly, Inc.
U a «  M rkill 
RsttM CeaAn 
Feeats

a a t a  M tnaa etraip 
p a p a  BteaeA eenlHp

ReliiMin doesn t guarantee worldly siKx-ess The peoph- who are in 
church e s e r y  Sunday share their neifchbor's hopes and dreams But they 
a e  learning to cherish taJue$ which w ill make firmer their am s They 
a e  c hallenged by a faith  which te a h e s  men to use constnictis ely es ery 

achasem ent

D u n l a p ' s

d m ilw o o d  AAmll

The f ’hurch can help you culfisate relignius cons ktKms whK-h will 

mfliienie how you lis e o n  the was to your goals . and what yiHi becom e 
sehen you reach them

CHARLIE
WELCH

tatty Be*
Copra* 1 SopWM I t  end e« Tiie Amefxer Mu Soett

^  B t  a m i  Bela. 0 ILL. ra  St BBvetA vreetl 0  M I

PBtth Temple Church of 
God InChiiBt

ta p a  B*
ASSEMBLY OP CHB 1ST
Th*A***mhlyluChri«
PeUomhip
S r.2 lX m .a ta r.

t a p a  B t ia t M t a t

Greenwood Boptist
B ^ t t  M ta n  T IS • a  l a  

• a  l i t  a  U l S p a t M I p a  
WMAAtt U ta n  A U t ■  m A .  

A a
taatAtr M ta t  I t  a  saAtp a

MaH TotnABL 
, l t  «  C B aaariA l 

t  a  s a  SwAty i 
II a  1 a  U ifin .  
A M p a  Ym ^  
t a p a  B tM a.

9J0-50

W iaday
Mmrk

to  1316

Tuetdoy
Umk

lOIT^I

W fdnrtday 
Mark

10 32-52

Thuridai/ 
Uark 

II I II

hriday 
Uark 

II l2-2f>

Saturday
Uark

1127-31
irtti'B <Tly»'+ fTty>-4- <rt-»j ♦ rrt-n > frisj ♦ .criTi + <TtT) rrin +

LUTHERAN

a a t a  t a  
U a  « a  Uo

• a . a  SaaOtti
II a  A a  Ui n i l ,  
t a p a  B a o ia

t a p a  r ra a a tV o a .

MIdoBBB HeigbU Beptlat

Cmttmmm taotAiy 
p a i M t  u a . a p a  

BApatat BytpptAaato

I a  I Prue Church of God 
iB Christ in Jesus Nbhm

Grace Lutheran
a a a  GoecavaBopA

..MORMON
Church of Jcbub Christ of 
Letter-dBy SeintB

St. Ann's Spiritual 
Church

- '  9 Û/(A’s

t U * I 
w a i l

AUBMBLYOPGOD

C H R B 'n A N

Christian Church of 
MldUnd

a iB  T arai| i 
t a p a  Cw

UchtbouB* Church of 
God la Christ

Uotoa. i i n SIp TW 
a r a a  apw vW a  Bta P a .  n a
Ik* DatrpttiMt

Tte Mtipia* « a  a  uk* a  a a  
T a  p a  SttaiM  ■•rikip

Suicint ir—oAlkt* SfitiiBiHfr*

UaiaeA CktM 
tM IT w M n lc 
HlAltaAWuA 
BarMonmi lukiB

• 4S t a  rruttsa* ■ttlwg 
a a t a  %mi»f aSal 
S a  p a  S*crta«a ttnrKt

laPB m a*ati 
■aktrB eaiw m iiat Pitar 

S 41 1 ■  SwatyKlMol 
t a p a  E «n a | »«r a a

INDEPENDENT

Midland Bible Church

Bethel ABeemWy *f Ged
B m M a t  P i« 

• a  I a  ta  
II a  1 a  Ut 
f a t a  B*

■m MIdktff Pint Beptlat
■ a M u ll M
BokttsB Stata u a a a t  
HttkC a t ta t  iH iriiii I 

t  U t a  kiw* t ita n  
a a t a  U arw aaw i

ata ratwoeAB*
■•* A a a T n a t .P a  

II a  • a  VaAtt I
Hope Luthertn

s a i a  taM*tttk**l 
II a  • a  U aaat 
t a p a  T ta aatta aa

u a p i
t a p a
t a p a

Culvery AeeemMy cf Ged 
akt MaaaM Northeid* Beptiit

CHRBTIANDISTIPLES 
OP CHRIST

I a  4 a
II a  t ata p a

• a  I a  k aa tt 
a  a  l a  a

PIrst AaeemMy i f  God
y a w  a t a a M
i n  i  •  r a a a  Paaa

I a  p a  Ckartk 
t a p a  B<

Bo*I T raatt

First ChiistlBB
la iw  I ta u iA it i

tn B * e s ta ,k s a
B*t Bok n i** il* f

Whites Chspei Church of 
God In Christ

B a n  AMraa 
l o t  B la a  B BatraB P a a t 

• 41 * a  l a i t y  what 
II a  4 a  Mira n  a r a a  TW 

i t r a a  Upa WIN a  Catat

PENTECOSTAL-CHURCH 
OF GOD OF AMERICA

aaN AM
Rri U n  lU lar P a a t 

I 41 t a  sa a tr  ak a l 
M a  I a  W trtkatm ict
r a p a  Ev*a*A>«rtSa

1109 Raikin Mwy.
UiAla* Tti4»

Q u a l if ie d

P.RINTERS
im iBBBISS -  OBVBAT

IB3«g* mt* BMirwi

TW rtMMrva t mrmmi mptc 
Lm N WW D m  Vbmp N BM

First PentecoBtel Church 
of God

P U * a  Satay i 
II a  I a  lltn a g  
A a p a  w p in r

tau

• a .a  u a ta  Uai ta p a  Bta

Primers Iflesis BeutisU
MezksuB
a t s  v y ia n

• M B M WiMBrarWal
M M B M Mbpbmh WBPM 

wrmBM MW* v«l W Mpti
TW

c m i i n r o n T O *
NAZARENE

Midland Laiharao
rwv niea^Bti
Bet DttM U ttaa  B a
“t ; :

wpiw putatM 
Bo* L  DttM A la . P ta a  

* U « B  SooAtySrkal 
II a  • a  H a ta . **nka 
T M p a  Biitait t t t a a

ta p ata p a ruBMryp
First Church of the 
Nasareu*

• a  a
T ta l ’

S 41 t a  saa ty  triaU 
II a  (

T n a *

AssemMy sf t  a  • a  Su Ain  
II a  • a  U aaat 
t a p a  T raatt 
t a p a  B n o a .

j * . . a M

Mbpwmib iiFWg TW 
m to wiMMi Dm Vbm

_  PENTECOSTAL 
r a l C m  ^  HOLINESS

Abundant Life Temple

l a  P ta O a t  Pttat 
SWMta la A i t i  a a ta  Maopa 
t a p a  Ckra

South Memoriel BeptM 
a

t a p a  B t a a p a n k a

JoruBBlem ABsemblyof
God
tan TMaM
B a  C i ip i l iV t lM  Pitar 

a a i a  k a a t a k a l  
II a  4 a  U aaat a ita u  
t a p a  B n o a to a ta a

lUPU Cl
Bat J •  tiaaB. Pi

l U t a  B tO a fy a ^ a  
S a t a  koaOtyttkal a a t a

Memoriel ChrisUen
a a  Aa*aet Wltwer 
Be* JokpU l e ^ w a a a  
J C 'Took T u tk a  Ai

la o U  L Ootim P ta a  
S U t a  SaMtyStkaal 

a  U I a  U in iiio o n k a  
I  a  p a  Bttaat atnkp 
t a p a  Ortop atttati

METHODIST 
Aebury United Methodist 
Church

t a i a  iBataM 
Be* A a PiatUy P ta a  

S 41 t ■  SotAty Sttnl 
II a  4 ■  M *ra a «ea a a  
t a p a  B**aatwonklp

TOJISlUTOm tUS ■tiSAcacn»K.ytu 
BA.*n u i t -

WANT ADS

DIAL 682*6222

MICHANO ODESSA HOUSTON

Fraternal 
Order of Eagles

Aerie No. 2982

riedricli
AM CONMTIOWNC NiATmC 
Jary'i Siwtf Mttkl Ck.

TOO N l< Watt '  tkAAAVS

BUILDERS A HOME 
OWNERS SUPPLY 
"Wt Sen hr U u '

. a i B  rk a rk a k a la a t a  Ua
I a  p a  r t ta a tM a a  
t a p a  B **a a ta a a a

I 4 a  Uatoaa atnOiiy TW 
■ UMtalUW Vtllt tktpktfAl alwtrnatt

Northslde Chdrch of the 
NBBareoe
taUatlrM  
Be* B ^ l

ata DakaiM
Be* Bey Ut**at P ta a

t tS I a  rh on t ataW 
a U l B  Utraag ttrota 
t a p a  u v r
t a p a  E*aaat aaMw

Tower Baptist
TW tm plaraaa W Um  1 l a  
• Up a  n r r  
t a p a  rW M at*ataarta

P U t  a  t a  
a u t a  Ue 
t a p a  B*i

EPISCOPAL

El Cslvario Ifletia 
Metodlsta Unida

First United Pentecostal 
Church 
n a «  m aatM
iw* B O BarUot Pt

I B ■  StMMBF trn m I
U W B ■1 •• f ■

II«
MISSIONARY ALUANCE

Prlmtra Asembles Dios
I a  p a  T ta a a tU a a  
r a p a  B *oa w a uata

First Alliance Church 
a a «  utBM

iL aU paM . Pt
I a  • a  iM t y  I 

II a  t a  U iia tt 
t a p a  B*aoka

Travis Baptist
C B Okua

0  U B oa Piaa

Epiacopel Church of the 
Holy Trinity

M

Be* kAaat4CWt«a a  P a a t 
I U I a  Ckartk akoU 

II a  t a  Uetoat eonMp 
y a p a  B ttaatatraip

THE
BIBLE Bnd 
BOOKHOUSE
9 Metk Dria 
laTW VBhyt

The Midlond 
Beporter-Telegrom

TW Ibis liiPBifB»B«t 
Hr fam

Air̂ rftttap OaBm

E L E a R I C  

M o t o r  S e r v i c e

1409 W. IndtPttrWl Av«. 
Dial 4 4 1 4 3 1 3

10 «  a ■
11 «  • •  f M 0 ■

IWr
MU« nw• «i • • t Uaa

II W B M

METHODIST 
First United

JesuB Name Gospel 
Lighthouse

Methodist
I Iran

Tsmpte Nessreth 
UttfuSSaa M **

t a i l  
II a  t a  Uoroap i ir a n  
t a p a  T tium Upia 
t a p a  B too la a tta u

Church

PWB WeaagWaW 
B M a D a P tfta  Puwr

M a t a  koaty M tal 
t a p a  Priyvr 
t M p a  E y itt t llilK

M a t a
t a p a

Valley View Baptist

CHRB'nAN SCIENCE 
First Church of Christ.
Scientist

BAFTMT-OfDtFINDIirr
I a  p a  B*

Bethsl Baptist
uaTyptuM
Sr ■ I  Dty P ta a

TBrrr f\B»iB€

BMtl
tam iif erWBl 
IWrosaC BBPvirB TW

le t a t  a r a a  atu W It iw FOURSQUARE GOSPEL 
U a m a  W tlotat Ut* Btot*a ky -

t  »  4 a  
II a  t a

St. Nicholas Eplacopal
■ a P r a a la W  
Be* J t a a  L CaUtka. BttWt 

I a  • a  nay BarWrai 
W a  • a  M y  E a k tra  tlank aWa
t M p a  M y  Borktra <Rk*m

M U  U ta U
Dr ChMla B UMck. Uk
Be* Itryy UyM. 
■e* BWWMr Aai

SA NITARY

k*4^BB7l

Plumbing t  Heoting

ROGERS
F O R D  S A L E S

U NiykaayM kW lU

Sears
SCABS, BOEBUCC AND CO.

. M t a  l a t i y  irk a  
W ■  • a  U aaat aanUp t a  

Tit* a  l*aa a  m i tuaU
I M p a  v*ip*r t*r*lt* 

CtaWlaM ar*lr*

PRESBYTERIAN-UNITED

t a  t a  
w a  t a  
• a p u
( U p a

Wsst Kentucky Baptist 
Chspei

AtaaU P an*'
TW Catta T»a e «  W AlWou 

l a  IW Lett Cat *a*tpa**l 
ra lgaa  'B*« It t '

Foursquare Gospel
* i t «  A iu a

Greater St. Lake A M E.

T rsaatV olaBtoaMaatUki

I U t a  taM*y irWa 
M It • a  rharrt a**!** 
T M p a  P*«aa|i*t*«a

CHURCH OP CHRBT 
Church of Christ

t 4t t a  Soatiy wkta 
II a  • a  Uiraat **nka 
T M p a  B*t«at o«nka

(AkPicta HadaOM Bpmopt 
MIS Ataakl 
B** T r  B*rraa HtaiWt 

t  H t  a  Ckartk ak*a 
M n  t a  
I W p a  
T M p a

Christ Presbyterian
■PIN OtrflatSi 
Dr BaklltlnB. Ptaar • M B ■ «̂reli tpW»l 

II M a ■  IWnuMf wirBfcip

u*raar.«a.a PRESBYTERIAN U S.
Pawaiklp N*w - ---------

Open 6 Days A Week

MIKE'S
AUTO PARTS. INC.

h 0 0C*«*0Bf«M
lltlB tumswid hl1 i«BI

The
Goodhousekeeping

Shop
Town A Country 
Shopping Center

UNUSfD ITEMS ARE QUICK 
SOURCE Of EXTRA CASHi

SELL 1M
WITH A WANT ADI 

Diel 612-5311

Kelview Heights Baptist WUshlr* Park Baptist 
m t

M M t a  Soatty trWa 
■  M t a  UitaatoatMi 
i n  p a  B*«Mafaatakl

IB bum PmMt 
t U I a  kootty Iikaa 

II n  t a  Uaratat oonki 
A n  p a  TYMtiat Uoaa 
I M p a  BtaoMt oorM)

Psrhlsa Baptiat
Set V^^SmX i Pm m

P M t M  koattyl 
■  M t a  Ui III. 
T M p a  BooMm

BAPTIST-OTHERS 
GalUa* MlsBiouary
Baptist

UIIH PI «• > ■ ■
ClyBlO PiMMIt HMWtt 

t n  I a  BMI* twAy 
N M i a  Uiraat attMa 
I n  p a  VaMk a tt ia t  
t n p a  B itaat atrtNp

Church of Christ
UttW A Akt Ti l i iM ilt WwU
WWMa P UtUtr HWItWr 

I  M i a  •W trltnt*
M a  t a  Uttaku eonka 
t M p a  Bttkku »tnku

FREE METHODIST 
Free Methodist
ITUMtAyUktll 
B** i t k t t r P Vawa. Ptaat 

t U i a  toktiyak**!
II M t a  Uaroiat aattka 
T M p a  Bvia t t  aonka

HoUoirell United 
Methodist

Church of Christ

Ttmpk Baptist

IWW PaaatyTttMtM 
W a  t a  Uttakua 
I n  p a  BttkMta

Iglesta Method ista Libre
U lt  TmtoBM 
B** MWCMUBt. PMWt 

M M • a  toktiT trlaa 
II n  • a  UtfOku atnka 
t M p a  BtroMtoottka 
T M p a  Pram  a m tit

Mkt UinktaM 
B*t C U UMir PtiMr 

t M i a  Ckorctaktti 
II M I a  Utralag M nka 
I n  p a  UYP 
t M p a  Ut«WtMH*a 
T M p a  Bttalat aoraka

Midkiff First United 
Methodist

tika
B*« StiWw L r rat wl it  Ptaat 

tU ia  Uatolaf oorata

Church of Christ
M M  t a  
II n  t a  
« U p a

GoodwiU Baptist

Trhuty Baptist

0 * ^ r * S k lt y  iHaal 
II M t a  Uiraku t a Ma 
t M p a  MMtaoty

4MB CiSaaiM  
B** A u  «M ka 

t  4t ■ a  Wa 
II n  t a  iwt 
I a  p a  B**

IIW wmaW 
M M i a  Utraaf rtka 
i n  p a  BTtoMt aoraka

Grace Baptist

Church of Christ
tnW  Ditaprtai 

M n  1 a  Utroku oa 
T M p a  B*tMkt oa

FRIENDS
The Midland Friends 
Meeting
TYMtbrWknIUtrtry 
■M W  WpMtyAtt 
rn arD  CWit.Clift

St. Luke's United 
Methodist Church

Covenant Presbyterian
■M U  DlkalaU
Dr OartnGirlMMkin.MkMttor 

I M t a  rtortk trWa
It W B Ml MBfiMiH wnrvlllp IM]r 
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City churches slate musical rites
Musical services and special 

worship evenu are Kheduled Sunday 
in Midland churches to mark the 
fourth Sunday in Advent and the 
beginning of Christmas Week

Christmas cantata
The Chancel Choir of St. Paul 

United Methodist Church. 4501 
Thomason Drive, will present a 
Christmas cantata. “ Christ Is Bom.”  
by John W Peterson, during the 10:50 
a m. Sunday worship service.

The choir is directed by Doug 
Browne. Organ accompaniment will 
be provided by Luanne Orrell.

The St. Paul congregation will have 
its annual service of carols and 
candles during the 7 p m worship 
hour The service will be climaxed 
with a special offering for the church 
budget.

Christian musical
Crestview Baptist Church. 3300 

Thomas St., will celebrate the 
Christmas season with two special 
programs Sunday.

During the 11 a.m. worship hour.

n

Betty GUser MUler

the church's Sanctuary Choir will 
present a new Christian musical. “ His 
Love ... Reaching..”  by Ron Huff and 
Bill Gaither. The choral work, 
directed by Ty Morris Jr., will have 
accompaniment provided by piano, 
organ and a percussion ensemble 
The Rev. Kenneth James. Crest- 
view’ s pastor, will narrate the 
scriptural text.

At 7 p.m. Sunday, the Crestview 
congregation will gather in the sanc­
tuary for a traditional family carol 
and candlelight service. The event 
will feature music by the choir, 
handbell ensembles and a band en­
semble. A Christmas message will be 
presented by the pastor

Both the Sunday services will be 
open to the public.

Lessons and carols
The choirs of First United. 

Methodist Church downtown will 
combine to present a traditional 
Service of Lessons and Carols during 
the Sunday morning worship hour, 
beginning at 10:35.

Leading the service will be Dr. 
Charles Lutrick. senior minister.

Speaker
announced

Midland's Church of the Dayspring, 
310 N. Weatherford St., will hold 
s p e c i a l  f u l l - g o s p e l  in- 
terdenominational services tonight 
and Sunday morning.

Betty Glaser Miller and her 
husband. Bud Miller, from “ Christ 
Unlimited”  at Irving, will be speaking 
at the services. Today’s service is 
scheduled for 7:30 p.m. and the 
Sunday event will begin at 11 a m., 
said Tom G. Wood, pastor of Church 
of the Dayspring. The services will be 
open to an interested persons

Wood said that Mrs. Miller has 
ministered extensively in the South­
west and has made a missionary 
journey to India. Her husband 
recently joined her special ministry 
after many years in the business 
world.

joined by Bill Weir and Jerry Wyatt, 
a s s o c ia t e  m in is te rs  o f  the 
congregation, and Richard Gilmer, 
m inister-in-t ra ining

Featured in the musical service will 
be the Chancel. Junior and Carol 
Choirs, as well as the Youth Handbell 
Choir. The program has been planned 
and d irect^  by George L DeHart, 
organist-choirmaster of the church

The majcH* work in the service will 
be the “ In Dulci Jubilo" of Bux­
tehude, with violin accompaniment to 
be provided by May Adelaide Barber 
and Ann Zacharias.

The Junior Choir will sing “ Every 
Child Stand Up and Sing.”  featuring 
flute accompaniment by Paula 
Beshears. The Youth Handbell Choir 
will offer a “ Fantasia on Christmas 
Carols,”  by Alinda B. Couper, and the 
ensemble also will provide ac­
companiment for the Junior Choir in 
"Now Behold Our Newfound Joy," by 
Couper.

Other selections to be presented 
during the service will be “ God Bless 
the Little Things”  by the Carol Choir; 
"Carol of the Questioning Child”  by 
the Junior and Chancel choirs; “ Long 
Ago in Bethlehem,”  by the Junior 
Choir; “ Joy Has Filled the Sky,”  by 
the Chancel Choir, and “ The Friendly 
Beasts”  and “ Away In A Manger.”  to 
be sung by the choral union

The musical service will be open to 
the public, with the church nursery to 
be available for infant and child care

Holiday music
The combined Youth and Sanctuary 

choirs of Alamo Heights Baptist 
Church, 1305 N Midland Drive, will 
present a program of Christmas 
music in the Sunday evening worship 
service, beginning at 7.

‘ “ Specially for Shepherds.”  a 
contemporary Christmas cantata 
co m p o s t  and arranged by Ralph 
Carmichael, will be the featured 
presentation of the evening The 
cantata is being directed by Ken Kell, 
minister of music and youth at Alamo 
Heights Church. Featured soloists 
will include Tracye Trimble as Mary, 
John Marks as Joseph and Jimmy 
Hennesey as Gabriel.

The public has an invitation from 
the Rev. Milo B. Arbuckle, host 
pastor, to attend Alamo Heights

Church’s musical service

Story of Christmas
The adult Chancel Choir and the 

children’s choirs of St Luke’s United 
Methodist Church. 3011 W Kansas 
Ave., will join in presenting a special 
musical program during the 10:50 
a m Sunday worship sers ice

The presentation will be “ The Story 
of Christmas,”  compiled and 
arranged by choir director Don 
McCartney The lighting of the fourth 
Advent candle will also be a part of 
the service

Sunday evening, children's choir 
groups at St Luke’ s will go caroling 
at local nursing homes and at home’ 
of shut-ins Also planning a caroling 
party that evening is the junior high 
United Methodist Fellowship group

The Rev. 0  A McBrayer, pastor of 
St. Luke’ s and Mrs McBrayer will be 
hosts for an open house at the church 
parsonage between C:30 and 9 p m 
Sunday.

Music ministry
The music ministry of First Baptist 

Church, West Louisiana and Garfield 
streets, will present “ His Love ... 
Reaching,”  by Ron Huff and Bill and 
Gloria Gaither, at 7 p m Sunday in 
the church sanctuary.

“ His Love . Reaching”  is a service 
of celebration, a joyous, festive 
celebration of God's reaching into the 
world through the gift of His Son.

The presentation, under direction of 
David Campbell, minister of music 
at First Baptist Church, will feature 
the adult choirs and special soloists, 
plus children's choir, narrator and 
handbell choir.

The service will be open to the 
public.

Night for Dancing
The Episcopal Church of the Holy 

Trinity. 1412 W Illinois Ave., will 
have a Christmas dinner Sunday 
evening, to be followed by presen­
tation of a musical pageant by 
children of the parish.
^ h e  pageant is titled "A Night for 

Dancing,”  and it will be presented by 
the Angel and Junior choirs of the 
p a r is h , with instrum ent a c­
companiment

Cfiurch taxation again an issue
Jesus

the things that are Caei 
that are God’s 
—M arkl2:M

on the subject of taxes
A r ’s,

Render to Caesar, 
and to God the things

By JOHN DART 
The Los Angeles Times

t
The possibility is rather remote that churches, 

temples and other houses of worship will soon be 
under pressure to render taxes to Uncle Sam, say ex­
perts in church-state relations

And yet:
—The Rev. Dean Kelley, the National Council of 

Churches' director of religious liberty, has a book out 
this year called “ Why Churches Should Not Pay 
Taxes.”

—A church-sponsored conference last month on 
“ Taxation and the Free Exercise of Religion”  in­
cluded pro and con talks on whether churches should 
be taxed.
— In Washington, D.C., a City Council-appointed 
citizens’ commission has proposed that churches, 
museums, libraries and other tax-exempt institu­
tions pay 10 percent of what would be their taxes in 
order to lower the average tax rates Regardless of 
the proposal’s chances of adoption, it reflects the 
pressures on governmental bodies to broaden the tax 
base into nonprofit areas

—Some government officials are asking whether 
“ church”  and “ religious”  can be defined in legal 
terms so as to prevent the proliferation of phony* 
churches as a tax dodge.

A brothel-“ church”  has been known to offer sister­
ly love to male parishioners in exchange for dona­
tions, according to an Internal Revenue Service at­
torney.

The best known instance of bogus religion is the 
“ religious”  residents of the Hudson Valley township 
of Hardenburgh, N Y.

At last count, 235 of 239 private individuals owning 
real estate there had been granted a religious tax ex­
emption by the assessor because the owners 
declared their property to be branches of the Univer­
sal Life Church, a mail-order “ denomination.”

The New York State Division of Equalization and 
Assessment has challenged the validity of the 
Hardenburgh exemptions Similar applications for 
exemptions have been made in six nearby towns, but 
only a “ sprinkling”  were approved in three of the 
communities.

Main-line church leaders generally prefer a cer­
tain vagueness or lack of definition of religion in the 
law. The form and content of religious practice itself 
varies so greatly, they say, that legal definitions tend

Chairman elected
Johnny Warren was elected chairman of the ^ard  

of deacons of the First Presbyterian church lo r  
1978 at its officer-election meeting earlier this

*^ th e r  new officers are Richard Rowan, vice 
president; Mrs. Jack Steele, secretary; Larry Bell, 
treasurer, and Jack W. Young, assistant treasurer.
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to restrict freedom of religion.
The hands-off principle that American churches 

have come to cherish is based on the opening lines of 
the First Amendment; “ Congress shall make no law 
respecting an establishment of religion, or pro­
hibiting the free exercise thereof .”  Religious 
organ iza tion s  often do pay som e taxes 
and assessments The three-county Los Angeles 
Catholic Archdiocese, for example. last year paid 
11.6 million in taxes and assessments on rectories, 
land held for future use and other property not used 
for strictly religious purposes.

Church-own^ “ unrelated businesses”  filed 
federal income tax returns for the first time this year 
— a change in the tax law which major religious 
bodies suggested to Congress for its Tax Reform Act 
of 1969

During the interim grace period allowed by that 
act, the Akron. Ohio, Cathedral of Tomorrow cut 
loose its much-mentioned girdle factory in Brooklyn. 
Just how many businesses have been affected is 
unknown, but they include Catholic diocesan 
newspapers that now pay taxes on their advertising 
income.

Before 1970, the U.S. Supreme Court had never 
dealt with the broad question of tax exemption and 
the churches.

But that year it upheld a lower court denial of 
lawyer Frederick Walz’ contention that church pro­
perty tax exemption violates the First Amendment 
stricture against establishing religion Walz contend­
ed the New York State Tax Commission's exemption 
of churches indirectly required him to contribute to 
religious bodies

In writing the 7-1 majority decision. Chief Justice 
Warren E . Burger denM  that the tax law attempted 
to establish religion. “ It is simply sparing the exer­
cise of religion from the burden of property taxation 
levied on private profit institutions,”  Burger said.

“ The legislative purpose of the property tax ex­
emption is neither the advancement nor the inhibi­
tion of religion; it is neither sponsorship nor hostili­
ty,”  he said, but one of “ benevolent neutrality .”

“ The question is not forever resolved,”  says Leo 
Pfeffer, special counsel for the American Jewish 
Congress and a man who has argued more church- 
state cases before the U.S. Supreme Court than any 
other attorney.

Pfeffer happens to believe that houses of worship 
should not be tax-exempt, that they should “ pay their 
fair share of the tax burden.”  But he also believes 
that church exemption is “ safe”  for many years to 
come, despite the continuing pressures for more tax 
sources.

Religious tax exemption has had wide popular sup­
port in American history even though three 
Presidents have spoken against it.

James Madison. Ulysses S Grant and James A. 
Garfield viewed it as a violation of church-state 
separation. Grant said in his seventh message to 
Congress; “ I would suggest the taxation of all pro­
perty, equally, whether church or corporation, ex­
empting only the last resting place of the dead, and 
possibly, with proper restrictions, church edifices.”

Church exemptions, however, have become “ a live 
issue only during the past two decades,”  according to 
James E. Wood Jr., executive director of the Baptist 
Joint Committee on Public Affairs.

“ The crucial question is not. however, over any 
possible sweeping removal of tax exemption of 
religion as such,”  Wood said at a taxation-and- 
churches conference which his Baptist committee 
sponsored last month in Washington
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Church plans events 
for Christmas Week

First Presbyterian Church of 
Midland is announcing a series of 
Christmas Week worship events 

Noontime worship services will be 
held Monday, Tuesday and Wed­
nesday in the chapel at First 
Presbyterian Church. The 30-minute 
services will begin at 12 and conclude 
by 12:30 p m They will be open all 
residents of the community. For 
persona wishing to eat before or after 
the services, a sandwich bar will be 
open in Room 129 of the church 

The Rev. Elmer E. Burrall. pastor 
of Midland’s Hope Lutheran Church, 
will be the speaker at Monday’s 
service. Special music at the event 
will be presented by George deHart, 
organist-choirmaster at First United

Methodist Church here, and Steve 
Spain, organist and choir director for 
First Christian Church

Featured speaker for Tuesday’s 
service it to be the Rev. Steve Ed­
wards. minister of Midland’s First 
Christian Church Special music will 
be provided by Robert La Fontaine, 
head of the music department at 
Midland College

Speaker at the third and final 
service at noon Wednesday will be Dr 
Charles Lutrick, senior minister of 
First United Methodist Church here. 
Presenting the music will be Phyllis 
Cowden, a member of the Motet Oiolr 
of First Presbyterian Church, and 
Robert E. Poer, minister of music for 
the church.

The two matters of more immediate concern to 
churches are:

1— The IRS requirement, new this year, that many 
church-related hospital and other agencies have to 
file Form 990, which gives financial information, 
and..^

2— The fear that tax exemption will be lifted by the 
government in cases where it deems a religious 
organization’s attempts to influence legislation are 
“ substantial”

Church groups are fighting mad on the first item 
Although filing Form 990 does not require them to 
pay taxes, religious leaders believe the new IRS rul­
ing enters dangerous territory by talking about what 
is or is not “ exclusively religious.”

Asst. IRS Commissioner Alvin D. Lurie this month 
defended the new rule as not attempting to define 
what church activities are but which church-related 
organiiaUoos should be financially accountabte.

Laura Beth CottM Jerry W ayMFItaian

Area students°among 
seminary's graduates

FORT WORTH -  Winter com­
mencement ceremonies of South- 

.w e s te r p  B aptist T h e o lo g ica l 
Seminary were held Friday 

Among the 265 candidates for 
degrees from the seminary's three 
Mhools were former MIdlander Laura 
Beth Cotton, daughter of Mr. and Mrs 
Russell Cotton, and the pastor of 
Greenwood Baptist Church in the 
Greenwood Community of Midland 
County, Jerry Wayne Pitman 

The seminary’s largest winter

Sraduating class to date received 
agrees and diplomas from seminary 

president Dr Robert E Nsylor The 
graduates included 25 doctoral 
candidates

Miss Cotton received the master of 
religious educstion degree Pitmsn 
received the doctor of ministry 
degree

Lavonn D Brown, pastor of First 
Baptist Church s^ JSovnan*. Okla., 
was the spesker st the com-

mencment ceremony, held Friday 
morning in Fort Worth's TraviM 
Avenue Baptist Church - 1

Southwestern Seminary is a fully 
accredited graduate institution whose 
basic purpose is to train men and 
women for the Christian ministry. It 
is one of six seminaries owned and 
operated by the Southern Baptist 
Convention

Special 
service set

A special service Thursday night at 
the Midland Church of God, S300 
Thomason Drive, will have the Rev. 
Floyd La whon as guest speaker 

Lawhon, widely-known evangelist, 
is director of evangelism and home 
missions for the Church of God In the 
state of Virginia

The Thursday service will be open 
the public, K was announced.

Rev. Walter Kornelaen

Missionary.couple 
to visit Midland

The Rev and Mrs. Walter Kornelaen, Assemblies 
of God missionaries, will be guests of Midland's First 
Assembly of God Sunday.

The couple will be speaking at the 7 p.m. worship 
service of the First Assembly of God, 100 W Wadley 
Ave. The public is Invited by the Rev. J. W Farmer, 
host pastor, to hear them.

The Komelsens, whose headquarters are in Costa 
Mesa, Calif., began their long missionary career in 
1950 and rtow have completed six missionary tekms. 
They have served in Liberia, Nigeria, Sienia Leone 
and the Republic o( South Africa, in addition to 
Mexico and Panama. Their work has been primarily 
in the field of m issionary evangelism. i \

Kornelaen attended Central Bible Cotlege at 
Springfield, Mo., Tabor College at HUIsborp, Kan., 
and Kansas State University. At one time he served 
as pastor of a church in a suburb of Fresno, Calif. 
During World War II he was an officer in the U. S. Air 
Force.

The Komelsens have written two books on their 
missionary work

GARDENS ASSEMBLY of GOD
ANNOUNCES ITS

CHRISTMAS SCHEDULE
SUNDAY - DEC. 18 

10:50 A.M. -THE VIRGIN BIRTH 
Scriptural, Sound doctrino-Pastor Coxo 

7:50 P.M. -  SPECIAL M U SK

WEDNESDAY • DEC. 21 
7:00 P.M. • THE READY HEART 
CMIdren'i O irittm as Program

(TrMts Far A l Uba AttaMi)

CHRISTMAS DAY
10:30 -11:30 P.M. - FAMILY CHRISTMAS 

COMMUNION  
6:00 P M -G O D 'S  TREES 

Dymonic Poftrayd of Mongers, Boots, 
Crosses oNd Heoven
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CHARLEY REISE:
Many strategic minerals 
come from South Africa
By CHARLEY REESE 
Sun Belt Syndicate
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'Smothered' is right
O k L ah oroa  C i t y ' i  D a ily  

Oklahoman Mya editorially that 
Irony ahoundi in the dilemma in 
which lA w ton , Okla.. officiaU 
find themaelvea as they con­
template the effect on the city'a 
Image of pursuing a federal grant 
which could provide needed 
financial relief.

It's the same old story as told 
and retold in communities across 
the land, when local government 
units seek and receive federal 
funds.

H ere's the Lawton story, as told 
by the Dally Oklahoman;

"T o  obtain a share of S400 
million available nationally under 
a federal community develop­
ment action grant program, 
Lawton would have to qualify as a 
'distressed' city. It already meets 
three of the seven criteria 
apecified by the government 
Four ‘distress' symptoms are 
necessary to qualify for a grant

"A n oth er sympton Lawton 
m unicipal o fficia ls are con­
sidering is the fact the com ­
m u n ity 's  e con om y  depends 
heavily on the nearby Ft. Sill 
m ilitary base Thus, an entity that 
has been so important to Lawton's
MkAAAflftijL M£k MLkM^h M

part of its image now is deemed 
the key to its being labeled, a 
'd istressed 'city .

"E ven  more ironic is the con­
tradiction implied in the federal 
program 's aims. The idea of the 
grants is to help cities to react

quickly to take advantage of 
market conditions as they arise 
and stimulate new and increased 
private investment.

"Y et Lawton civic leaders fear, 
w ith  good  reason , that a 
‘distressed city’ label would only 
drive away prospective investors. 
Nothing is as valuable to a city in 
the hunt for new industry as its 
good name and a reputation as a 
thriving, dynamic community.

"Law ton 's dilemma is a classic 
demonstration of the stranglehold 
W a sh in gton  g e ts  on lo ca l 
government. Its Big Brother act 
ends up smothering the cities in 
red tape."

City of Midland officials know 
exactly the situation with which 
Lawton is faced when it comes to 
federal grants. Plenty of strings, 
and red tape, are attached, 
pointing out once again that there 
is no such thing as a free lunch

This is but another reason why 
the Midland City Council, by a 4-2 
vote, decided last Tuesday not to 
apply for a fourth year Com­
m unity  D evelopm ent Block 
Grant, after officials of the 
Departm ent of Housjng and 
(Jrban Development had turned 
down the city's application for 
1977 because the city would not 
g iv e  ‘̂ n to one o f HHD's 
requirements, which the city 
would not buy

T h ere  isn 't any halfw ay 
Ifrounds when it comes to dealing 
with federal government agen­
cies.
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Bureaucracy through the ages

By JACK 
WHITTEN

ANDERSON and LES

Four-dav school week
School students — and teachers 

— in Texas undoubtedly will be 
watching with interest the out­
com e of a proposed four-day 
school week in neighboring N ew ' 
M exico.

News reports out of Santa Fe 
quote the State of New Mexico 
cabinet secretary as saying a 
proposal may be submitted to the 
ItTS Legislature which would 
permit four-day school weeks in 
that state.

The secretary explained that 
the proposal would allow the State 
Board of Education to deviate 
from  the existing school calendar 
if the same number of hours were 
included.

Several New Mexico school 
districts reportedly have utilised 
the shorter week with a marked 
degree of success

But the legality of the schedule 
has com e under challenge from 
th e  N ew  M ex ico  a ttorn ey  
general’s office.

There really is no good reason, 
apparently, why the shorter week 
proposal shouldn't be approved by 
the legislature, aa long aa the 
sam e number of hours Is Included 

Organised labor has advocated 
such a work plan for years, and 
several companies have instituted 
it on a trial basis, with varying 
degrees of success.

'Hie matter, insofar as schools 
are concerned, should be left up to 
local school districts

ITNAPFENEONEtE
THIRTY YEARS AGOtDec 17,1147);

The Midlatid Memorial Hospital 
Building Fund campaign today was 
well "over-the-top”  In Ha original goal 
of laoO.OOO and was on its way toward 
the new SI million goal. Cash and 
pledges received to date total 
MU.9M

Midland's cHy council has voted to

frant Baseball Manager Harold Webb 
7S0 to be used for construction of a

minimum of 290 extra bleacher seats 
at Indian Park

WASHINGTON -  C N Parkinson. 
In propounding his law that the 
volume of work will always expand to 
accommodate the rising number of 
employees, drew his best examples 
from the waning British Empire He 
showed how the clerical force of the 
Royal Navy expanded in inverse ratio 
to the decline in the number of ships

This internal drive toward ex­
pansion can be seen at every period of 
the bureaucratic age, from its infancy 
in Prance to its maturity in America 
The birth of the first modem 
bureaucracy was heralded by the 
appearance of a handful of royal 
officials In the French Court late in 
the 12th century So feverishly did 
they multiply thst by. 1303. a royal 
decree had to be issued ordering the' 
dismissal of four out of every five 
officials

The decree was resisted suc­
cessfully, thus initiating an unbroken 
historical pattern By the lath "cen­
tury, according to the Duke de Saint- 
Simon, there were ao.OOO officials 
involved merely in sdministering the 
salt tax. In contemporary America, 
there are IS million public servants at 
all levels of government

The goal ot most bureaucrats is to 
avoid unfavorable attention, which is 
best accomplished by steering clear 
of hot potatoes Veteran bureaucrats 
are skilled at evading issues, shifting 
responsibility and diverting decisions 
to someone else. The more com­
mittees and subcomnittees there are 
to share the burden of decision, the 
less chance there is that any single 
bureaucrat will be blamed

The d e d ica te d  b u re a u cra t, 
therefore, places his faith and trust in 
non-decisions He operates on the 
p r in c ip le  that he cannot be 
reprimanded for decisions he does not 
make This has produced a game — 
which is played in just about every 
government office — of pau-the-buck 
and shuffle-the-papers 

Consider the case of the Weeguahic 
Park Plata building in Newark, N.J 
As far back as May, 1978. officials of 
the Housing and Urban Development 
Department were advised that sec­
tions of the outer wall of the 24-story 
structure were in danger of collapsing 
onto the busy intersection where the 
building stands

An independent consulting engineer 
warned the federal authorities that 
"corrective action must be ac­
complished as soon as possible, for 
one does not know if and when large 
sections of brick may fall."

His report was passed around the 
Housing and Urban Development 
Department Officials exchanged 
memos and held diMussions but 
ignored the warning 

For example, the area director, 
agreeing that “ a very dangerous 
condition exists which must be 
corrected," passed the ball to the U S 
attorney on the grounds that “ the 
project is within your jurisdiction "

By October 1971. HUD's own 
en gin eer notified the federal 
authorities that “ collapse of two 
sections of the fswnt wall at the 
seventh and tenth floors is im­
minent." In alarm, he added: "These 
sections can fall onto the nearby 
sidewalk and injure pedestrians."

In December a year ago. Newark's 
buildings superintendent. Anthony

INSIDE REPORYi

President Jimmy Carter's New Year's resolution
By ROWLAND EVANS 
And ROBERT NOVAK

WASHINGTON -  Hopei Inside the 
Carter administration for better 
things next year have been boosted by 
this word coming out of the Oval 
Office: Jimmy Carter wants to rid 
himself of as many decisions as 
possible In the second year of his 
presidency

That is an unpublicited New Year's 
resolution both Carter cronies and 
key officials ' devoutly hope the 
President will not forget The over­
flowing in-basket that has become the 
trademark of this presidency not only 
means Mr. Carter may be devoting to 
much time to the wrong activity, it is 
also viewed inside the administration 
and on Capitol Hill as a source of 
positive harm. But bluntly, the 
president la solitary contemplation 
sometimes gets the wrong ideas about 
matters better left to the experts

This remarkable fact tells much 
about bhter disappointments, of the 
first Carter year felt by many of his 
supporters Supremely confident of 
his'^own idtellect. he hss.^velaped 
neither a ^ -notch  White House staff 
nor a tntked kHchen cabinet of ex­
perienced counselors. This leaves ho 
way to protect him from his own 
aiiainterpretatioo of the facts. Ac­
cordingly, his New Yehr's resolution 
to step back from the deluge of details

Evans Novak

is welcome 
mtnistratioo

net in the ad-

When Carter intimate Charles 
Kirbo visited here from Georgia 
recently saying how much older his 
friend Inok^, he echoed a prevailing 
theme of Washington While the 
conventional holiday wisdom of 1974 
and 1975 was that president Ford 
ought- to cancel his annual skiing 
vacation and get down to work, the 
conventional wisdom today is that 
President Carter ought to let up on his 

' work and get down tb play
Actually, there is divided opinion in 

his o ffic ia l fam ily about  ̂ the 
aeriousness of the President's 
workaholic 'affliction Some dfficiala 
point out he ii seldom at his desk 
much after S;30 p.m sad obviously 
enjoys weekends at Camp Davidi. But 
others note that whenever a ^  
wherever Mr Carter takes time on, 
he carries that obiguitous file folder 
bnlglnf with work—and actually 
plunges into H.

What worries everybody, in ad­
dition to whether the President is 
working too hard, is whether he is 
doing the wrong work Beginning with 
the economic stimulation package 
nearly a year ago, Mr Carter has 
probed and scrutinised every 
program with intensive, solHary 
study. The procedure reflects his 
m a ss iv e  s e lf -c o n fid e n c e  and 
engineer's belief that he can master 
any situation by himself

'The danger of this is best shown by 
tax reform Entering the presidency 
with his campaign litany that the tax 
system is "a disgrace to the human 
race”  but with precious few details, 
he became immersed in a self-taught 
cram course on the Internal Revenue 
Code

According to congressional tax 
experts. Mr. Carter got a few things 
wrong — dangerously wrong T ^  
decision to set aside comprehensive 
tax reform because of the needed 
quick tax cut next year saves him 
from most such mistakes., But in­
siders report that, as a self-educated 
tax expert, the President had checked 
the wrong box too many times on the 
option s l^ ts .

There a p  hordes of tax experts at 
Um  Treasury and in Congress whose 
n v ic f l  the President could tap. "But I 
ask yop ," one expert told us. “ who is 
going to stand up to the President, 
look him In the eye and tell him. 'Mr. 
President, you've got this stuff you 
studied an wrong'?"

Herein is reflected a deeper 
problem of the Carter presidency. His 
White House staff is regarded as 
grossly deficient in organization and 
partially deficient in high-caliber 
talent. With Kirbo and Bert Lance 
both in Georgia, there is no peer who 
can look the President in the eye and 
tell him he is wrong

Mr. Carter is not happy over the 
way his time has been allocated this 
year. He has expressed dissatisfac­
tion with the endless meetings selling 
the Panama Canal treaties and is now 
signalling that he really would like to 
delegate deskwork in a more 
traditional way.

He has asked Vice President 
Mondale to establish priorities for 
next year. This time he is devoting a 
mere fraction of the days spent on the 
previous year's economic review. 
Although he has studied the defense 
budget for unprecedented hours, this 
is supposed to be a one-time 
operation. Most important, the 
Presi^lent hat informed key officials' 
he wants to tee lets paper in hit in- 
basket. \

The prospect of President Carter 
spending l i ^  time in solitary coo^ 
templation cheers many officials. 
Looking further ahead, they would 
welcome more verbal give-and-take 
in the Oval Office and during in­
c r e a s in g ly  antiseptic cab in et 
meetings. But unfortunately that does 
not appear among hit New Year's 
resolutions for 197S.
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ORLANDO, Fla. -  South Africa 
has the ability to start a one-nation 
embargo against the U S. that would 
make the -Arab oil embargo seem 
pleasant by comparison.

Dr. Jack Penn, one of the world's 
foremost plastic surgeons and an 
English-speaking South African, said 
his country could do that because the 
U S. gets so many of its strategic 
minerals from South Africa

Raising a gin and tonic to his British 
colonel-looking moustached mouth, 
he smiled and said, "Of course that's 
the last thing in the world we want to 
do ."

He did not smile, however, when he 
said the current policies of the U.S. 
are " .  . . calculated to sever friend­
ship. leading to disaster for all con­
cerned."

English-speaking white South 
Africans like Dr Penn are viewed by 
the Afrikaaners, white descendents of 
early Dutch immigrants, as liberals. 
The English speakers, for example, 
have traditionally opposed some 
aspects of apartheid, but the 
Afrikaaners National Party has been 
in power for 30 years.

They are in an even stronger 
position now thanks to the Carter 
administration. Dr. Penn said

“ Your White House must have been 
swamped with telegrams of gratitude 
from National Party candidates," he 
said.

But what's most interesting and 
important for us is that even the

DeCastro, gave federal officials 10 
days to start correcting the violations 
DeCastro told us that the U.S at­
torney 's office promised .fullest 
cooperation Yet "nothing was done." 
DeCastro said

Last August 25. a section of the 
seventh floor shifted, and several 
bricks came spattering down For­
tunately, it happened after midnight, 
when the sidewalks were empty of 
pedestrians. Otherwise, several 
people could have been killed

The morning after the bricks spilled 
down from seven floors above, limited 
emergency repair work began. But it 
quickly came to a halt because of new 
bureaucratic fuddle. Typically, a 
spokesman for the housing agency 
disavowed any responsibility.and the 
assistant U.S. attorney handling the 
case brusquely refused to answer our 
questions ,

The inefficiency of the government 
bureaucracy has been documented 
again and again Yet the American 
people continue to call upon the 
bureaucrats increasingly to direct 
and control the nation's activities. 
The bureaucracy's dominance over 
other sectors of our society is 
becoming all-encompassing.

Not only does government at all 
levels now consume 40 percent of the 
gross national product, as compared 
to 10 percent 40 years ago. but every 
private enterprise of any consequence 
is now ensnarled in government red 
Upe

Bureaucratization entails the rigid 
ob serva n ce  of set rules and 
procedures, the interminable seeking 
of permission for any divergence 
Kept within its proper sphere, such 
rigidity is beneficent Imposed upon 
society at large, it results in 
stagnation

It is also well-established that those 
segments of the population in the 
benevolent toils of the bureaucracy 
become apathetic and succumb to the 
nothing-can-be-done-anyway syn­
drome We frequently see television 
interviews, for instance, with tenants 
of public housing. They may well be 
the descendants of those who cleared 
the wilderness Yet they complain 
listlessly that weeks have passed and 
no one has come around from the 
housing authority to fix the toilet or 
scrape off the flaking paint

All is left to the authorities, but no 
one trusts them to perform. Even­
tually this mistrust and resentment 
will spread to all authority, although 
the dependence on H does not lessen.

We have seen in our time the 
fulfillment of de Tocqueville's war­
ning that citizens who do not take part 
to some extent in the public ad­
ministration will forget how to make 
use of their franchise, will stop 
exercising it and will become 
d i s i l l u s i o n e d  wi th e l e c t e d  
representatives.

liberal white South Africans are in 
agreement with the Afrikaaners on 
three important points, according to 
Dr. Penn:

1. White South Africans will never 
under any circumstances consent to 
the one-man. one-vote black majority 
rule demanded by Vice President 
Walter Mondale. To do so would mean 
death and destruction as the various 
tribes repeated the intertribal war­
fare that has wracked every black 
African nation since the departure of 
European rule.

2. The black African states to the 
north, neither together nor singly nor 
with Cuban help, can defeat South 
Africa.

3. If the U.S. will leave them alone, 
South Africans will work out their own 
destiny in a way that will be equitable 
for all the people in the coulHry.

Those points are important because 
the Carter administration is ap­
parently acting on the assumption 
that the white government of South 
Africa is doomed — a theory put forth 
by Jules Nyerere, the Marxist

firesident of Tanzania, in the July 
ssue of "Foreign Affairs," an 

establishment publication.
"It 's  absurd,”  said Dr. Penn, who 

was a close friend of the late Dr. 
Albert Schweitzer. I think many 
Americans would agree with him. In 
the first place. H'a none of our 
business bow any nation runs its inter­
nal atfalrs. How Carter can justify an 
arms embargo against South Africa 
and at the same time encourage trade 
with the Soviet Union, one of history's 
moat murderous dictatorhsips. is 
beyond the realm of common sense. 
In the second place, the Marxist coun­
tries Carter's catering to are no 
friends of ours although they're pleas­
ed enough to'spend American money 
and sucker us into backing their at­
tempts to Install Marxist regimes in 
Rhodesia, Southwest Africa and South 
Africa.

In the third place, the majority of 
white South Africans are not nearly 
the inhuman racists they are painted, 
by leftist propagandists. South' 
African blacks have a higher stan­
dard of living than most people in the 
so -ca lled  independent A frican 
nations, not a one of which, by the 
way, has one-man. one-vote majority 
rule.

Dr. Penn pointed out, for example, 
that in the last election every one of 36 
extreme rightwing white candidates 
were soundly defeated by moderates 

It should be obvious, too. that in a 
country where there are 17 million 
Macks and only 3 millioa whites that 
not all the blacks air screaming one- 
man, one-vote or they would have it 
tomorrow

As a matter of fact, unlike the U.S 
where black Americans differ only in 
color from white Americans, South 
Africa's 17 million blacks are divided 
Into nine major tribes, each with its 
own culture, language, and customs 

What the whites and a majority of 
the b lacks want is separate 
development and that is the way the 
South A frican governm ent is 
proceeding, setting up and granting 
independence to what are called 
homelands Within these homelands, 
the tribes have complete authority to 
run their own affairs, except for 
national defense and foreign policy 
which are handled by the South 
African government 

Whether any of that seems proper 
to us or not is beside the point If it is 
to be our policy to liberate every 
ethnic group which does not have Hs 
own one-man. one-vote democratic 
government, then we must go to war 
tomorrow with the Soviet Union which 
confines 21 separate nationalHies 
within its own borders.

A convention ot surgeons recently 
announced that playing golf isn't 
beneficial to the heart compared to 
more strenuous sports such as 
squash I suppose that's why you 
never hear of squash widows

The announcement just doesn't 
make sense. Show me a doctor who 
doesn't play golf and I'll show you one 
who makes housecalls.

I feel sorry for the poor duffer who 
up to now, figuring he was doing a 
healthy thing, didn't mind if his game 
was rotten.

A bad golfer does tiis heart moi*e

(;ood than an excellent golfer. Those 
ong walks in the woods can be very

invigorating.

I know a fellow who hit so .many 
stray shots they made him quit the 
country club and join the Audubon 
Society.

Larry Flynt, pu'u'.t*'uer 
magazine, says he has

of Hustler 
seen the

^ h t "  and will turn toward religion 
This is ■; the most dramatic conversion 
since Charles Colson stopped running

rcr his grandmother ^
J  • \

Sadness has come over the world of 
pornography. la adult bookstores 
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Robot population increasing rapidly
Tho Washington Poat that dangles from the

W A S H I N G T O N  — ceilin g  on um bilical 
Welding together car springs, a worker guides 
bodies on an automobile the tool along a body 
assembly line is a mind- seam, pulling a trigger, 
deadening job. m ethodically tapping

Wrestling with a 40- together sheets of steel 
pound spot welding gun with bolu  of electricity.

have
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'outdoor octivities

for the cold weother oheod-
NOW OPDI TO < P.M. EVUT 

NIGNT 'Til CNRISTMASI

^su
B P O m r a

l  MCTCU SNOf 
3 OAR RIDGE SQUARE M3-3441

The assem bly line 
m o v e s  i n c e s s a n t l y ,  
hundreds of cars, tens of 
thousands of welds, shift 
after shift. It is a job 
more fit for a robot than 
fora  man

And that's how it's done 
in many automobile 
plants — by robots* Real 
robots Not “ Star Wars" 
fantasies but ISO.OOO 
mechanical men with 
mechanical names — 
V ersatron , Unimate. 
Milicron, Prab.

There are 2.000 to 3.000 
industrial robots working 
in American factories, 
estimates Ernie Sallot of 
the Robot Institute of 
America in Dearborn. 
Mich, an organization of 
r o b o t  m a k e r s  and 
masters.

Sallot said the U S 
rob o t  popu lation  is 
growing at the rate of 125 
to ISO robots per month 
The five American robot 
makers will sell $50 
million worth of them this 
year, he said

By 19M there will be a 
$3 billion a year robot 
market, predicts Joseph 
E n g e l b e r g e r ,  f i r s t  
president of the Robot 
I n s t i t u t e  and also  
president of Unimation. 
the Connecticut firm that 
is the largest producer of 
robots in America, tur­
ning out about 40 per 
month

Engelberger, who is 
regarded as the father of 
the robot busineu. is also 
the man with the best 
answer to the question 
“ What is a robot?"

“ I don't know how to 
d e f i n e  a r o b o t , "  
Engelberger said, “ but I 
know one when I see 
one."

Most “ Star Wars" fans 
probably wouldn't know a 
real robot if they saw one 
They aren't humanoid 
looking like CP30 or even 
loveable-looking garbage 
cans like R2D2.

" T h e  word rob ot 
conjures up pictures of 
little . mechanical men 
with flashing eyes and 
swinging arm s," said 
Kim Cannon,  sales 
m a n a g e r  f o r  AMF

Versatran. a robot maker Union (UAW) workers 
of Herndon, V'a Real each collecting $20,000 a 
robots aren't anything y**r in wages and fringe 
like that benefits

A Versatran Series F — Cannon said robots 
which the company says typically can pay for 
is the world's strongest themselves in a year to a 
robot — could easily pass year-and-a-half With
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BICYCLES 
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for oversized, deformed 
drill press, dragging its 
hydraulic heart and 
electronic brain behind it 
Mundane as it looks, the 
machine can learn 32 
different jobs — and 
remember more with the 
aid of a cassette recor­
der. It is sensitive enough 
to pack^ggs into cartons 
and strong enough to pick 
up a small car with its 
single hand

U n i m a t i o n ' s  best  
selling Unimate looks like 
a Sherman tank turret 
with a mechanical hand 
stuck on the end of the 
gun barrel.

Neither robot can walk, 
talk or see. but lack of 
these faculities is no 
handicap in the jobs most 
robots do.

Welding together car 
b od ies  is the most 
common assignment, and 
the auto industry is the 
biggest robot employer.

There are robots that 
unload glowing hot ingots 
with their bare hands, 
and robots that pack 
television  tubes into 
boxes with suction cup 
fingers.

What makes them 
rob o ts , by industry 
definition, is their ability 
to dupl icate  human 
motions George Munson, 
marketing manager of 
Unimation. defines robots 
as " s e l f - c o n t a i n e d  
c o m p u t e r - d i r e c t e d  
machines with memories 
capable of performing 
human functions "

Although most robots 
replace men in factories, 
robots are not marketed 
as c o m p e t i t i o n  for  
humans, said Cannon, 
who is Munson's coun­
terpart at AMF Ver­
satran

Robots instead are an 
alternative to what is 
k n o w n  a s  " h a r d  
automation" — machines 
built specifically to do a 
single job and nothing 
else. *

A robot welder can be 
reprogrammed and given 
a new tool and put to work 
unloading a diecasting 
machine, noted Mort 
Sullivan, who runs the 
AFM robot factory near 
Washington 's  Dulles 
Airport
. But the robot salesmen 
do stress that their 
mach ines  are often 
cheaper than people On a 
two-shift job in an auto 
plant, a $40,000 or $50,000 
robot welder can be 
cheaper to hire than two 
United Auto Workers

that kind of economics 
they ’ re a better in­
vestm ent than either 
people or automation

Because robots are 
r e l a t i v e l y  s i m p l e  
machines, Sullivan said, 
they can deliver better 
than 95 percent "up 
tim e" on a factory job

’ ’ T h e y ’ r e  g o o d  
workers," he smiled On 
a repetitive job like 
welding car bodies, he 
said. “ They don't get 
bored, they don't take 
coffee breaks, they don't 
go to the bathroom, and 
they don't get mad at the 
boss”

AFM — American 
Machine and Foundry, it 
used to be called — 
doesn't release sales or 
profit figures for its robot

m a n u f a c t u r i n g  
o p e r a t i o n s ,  w h i c h  
r e c e n t l y  were  c o n ­
solidated at the Herndon 
plant

AFM Versatran is 
generally estimated to be 
the second or third 
largest in the business, 
competing for the robot 
market share with Cin­
cinnati Millicron, which 
is the nation's No 1 
maker of machine tools 
and is rapidly increasing 
its robot business

The b iggest robot 
maker, Unimation. built 
robots for years without 
making any money, but is 
cred it^  with creating the 
commercial market with 
its highly successful 
teams of robot welders

The United Stales is not 
the world leader in 
robots The European 
and Japanese markets 
each post $100 million a 
year, in sales twice the 
size of the domestic 
market.

In Japan, government

subsidies encourage the 
replacement of human 
workers with robots 
M o s t  w e l l - k n o w n  
J a p a n e s e  industr ial  
companies produce their 
own robots — Kawasaki. 
Hitachi and Mitsubishi

Italy's Fiat, recently 
o rd er^  $6 million worth 
of Unimates. the largest 
robot order ever And 
some Olivetti typewriters 
are assembled by robots

T h a t  s o r t  o f  
sophisticated work is not 
what most U S. robot 
buyers are after. Cannon 
said

But mure sophisticated 
robots are in the works, 
according to Dr John 
E v a n s ,  a National  
Bureau of Standards 
specialist in robots and 
robot control.

I'Tww robots, Evans 
p r e d i c t s ,  will have 
computer systems that 
will enable them to learn 
faster In the not too 
distant future, they 
have vision
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CB radios increase aid 
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WASHINGTON ( A P I -  
Holiday travelers may 
find some comfort in 
knowing there's more 
e m e r g e n c y  aid im­
mediately available to 
motorists now than there 
ever was

Just consider these 
statistics:

—Ninety-four percent 
o f the state police 
departm ents use CR 
radios in some way in 
the i r  publ ic  safety 
programs, according to a 
survey by Inspector 
Robert E. Ellis of the 
Washington Metropolitan 
Police Department

—In addition. Ellis 
found, “ small towns, 
counties and large cities 
alike are interfacing 
(their police and other 
p u b l i c  sa fety  c o m ­
munications facilities) 
with CB radio users "

—One out of every nine 
cars now is equipped with 
a CB radio, according to 
estimates by the Elec­
t r o n i c  I n d u s t r i e s

Association , a trade 
group representing CB 
manufacturers

— T h o u s a n d s  o f  
volunteers monitor CR 
channels, often 24 hours a 
day, to offer assistance to 
motorists in trouble

The National Safety 
Council says more than 
1,000 persons died in 
traffic accidents during 
the Christmas and New 
Year's holidays last year 
Nearly 500 died this past 
Thanksgiving weekend

While there is no way of 
knowing how many other 
deaths may have been 
averted by emergency 
CB broadcasts, there is 
evidence that CB radio Is 
providing the quickest 
means for motorists to 
summoahelp

F or  instance,  the 
Missouri State Highway 
Patrol — a pioneer in 
state police use of CB 
radio — estimates CR 
reports cut Hs response 
time in half

Why* Because CB 
r e p o r t s  o f t e n  a re  
rece ived  directly by 
patrolmen or volunteer 
m o n i t o r s ,  t h e r e b y  
eliminating the need of 
the motorist to find a 
telephone, make the call 
and then have the in­
formation relayed back 
to the patrolman in the 
v i c i n i t y  o f  t h e  
emergency

Most police depart­
ments and volunteers 
monitor either Channel 
19, the truckers’ or 
travelers’ channel, or 
Channel 9. the frequency 
set aside for emergency 
and m otorist-aid in­
formation.

C B 'ers  have three 
main ways to summon 
help in emergencies try 
to reach a Smokey, or 
policeman, monitoring 
the radio; call for a 
monitor from REACT. 
ALERT or other volun­
tary organization, or ask 
for help from a local base 
or mobile station
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Shady ladies shift 
to Disneyland area
The Los Angeles Times

SANTA ANA. Calif -  
Pimps and prostitutes 
apparently sought refuge 
in the tourist and con­
venti on  areas  near 
Disneyland and the hotel 
strip in Anaheim, Calif., 
when Los Angeles police
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cracked down on them 
earlier this year in 
Hollywood

John E Marwin of 
the Oran ge  County 
Sheri f f ' s  Department 
criminal activity unit 
says, “ They teem to have 
moved to Anaheim after 
exiting Hollywood and 
the Sunset Strip, where 
the heat it on," Marwin 
said He noted that hit 
department, which hat 
its headquarters here, 
and the Anaheim Police 
Department had mounted 
a cooperative effort to 
control prostitution in the 
Disneyland area, where 
parents and children mix 
with conventioneers 

Frank Keuler, police 
chief in nearby Garden 
Grove, said he became 
aware that many of the 
women were refugees 
from Hollywood because 
they  c a r r i e d  maps 
showing the route to 
Anaheim
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MIGRATING BLACKBIRDS utilize a pasture of sheep o f the Phoenix Gazette. The blackbirds and sheep are good
l^ear Phoenix, Ariz., ih this picture by Ebby Haverlander companions until disturbed. ( AT Laserphoto)

Argentine junta traveling economic 
road leading to runaway inflation
By KAREN DEYOUNG 
Tm  Washington Post

on press and public 
criticism of Argentina's 
military junta, at least 

BUENOS AIRES — one Cabinet member. 
Despite tight restrictions Economy Minister Jose
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Martinez de Hoz, has 
become (air game (or 
critics ranging from the 
media to the man in the 
street.

Even such widely dif­
fering publications as 
clandestin e  guerrilla 
newslatters and military 
mouthpieces are par­
ticipating in the cam­
paign.  The econom y 
minister, whose long, thin 
face and protruding ears 
a re  a caricaturists '  
delight, has been various­
ly depicted recently as j  
mouse, a rat and a 
voracious wolf

The (act that such pot­
shots would not even, be 
contemplated against the 
rest of the extremely 
tough government, let 
alone be allowed to go un­
punished, means two 
things here. First, there 
is serious and widespread
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economic dissatisfaction 
in Argentina. Second, the 
junta prefers to use the 
criticism as a safety 
valve for other, unper­
mitted complainta.

Virtually every sector 
of the 24 million popula­
tion has a gripe against 
the minister. While in­
dustry resents a gradual 
lowering of the protective 
trade barriers imposed 
by previous govern­
ments. local and state 
governments complain 
about cutbacks In federal 
funding. But the most 
volatile and potentially 
most dangerous critic is 
the working class

The workers complain 
that real wages are 
frozen at levels as low as 
60 percent of what they 
were two years ago. At 
the same time, longstan­
ding price controls hkve 
been almost completely 
lifted, and prices of 
everything from milk to 
refrigerators spiral up­
ward with dizzying speed

October’ s cost-^-living 
increase was 12.S per­
cent. and inflation is ex ­
pected to hit 17S percent 
this year.

While parts of the world 
decry human rights viola­
tions here, and President 
Carter worries about 
Argentina's nuclear pro­
gram. the junta knows 
that the real threat to Us 
power lies in the rising 
price of beef, the staple of 
the Argentine diet.

A pound of beef that 
cost ISO pesos in May now 
is 400 pesos With the peso 
currently 540 to the 
dollar, the beef price still 
looks low from abroad 
For the average worker, 
however, whoM montly 
70,000 peso wage remains 
the same as in May when 
the peso was 345 to the 
dollar, U ii devastating

The official minimum 
w a g e ,  which many 
worilers earn, is less than 
half that figure.

Several weeks ago 
workers in at least 10 in- 
dustrie^eD edN niU ts^^

imposed anti-strike laws 
by striking for higher 
wages. At least three 
workers were reported 
killed in the strikes, the 
most comprehensive of 
which was a several-day 
shutdown of rail and sub­
way aervices

Temporarily subdued 
by military intervention 
a n d  t h r e a t s  o f  
widespread firings — 
along with a wage in­
crease that amounted to 
le u  than half of that 
demanded — the once 
mighty labor unions vow 
that the fight has only 
begun.

It was the strength of 
those unions, built on 
large-scale featherbed­
ding and artificially high 
w ages, the Economy 
Ministry  says,  that 
h e l p e d  b r in g  near  
econom ic catastrophe 
le u  than two years igo

Under the populist, 
union-backed govern­
ments of the late Juan D 
Peron. the state took over 
hundreds of (ailing and 
n o n - c o m p e t i t i v e  in­
dustries. erected tome of 
the highest import tariffs 
in the world and. by prin­
ting vast quantities of 
depreciated  currency 
managed to raiw work­
ing c la u  wages to levels 
most economists now 
agree were far beyond 
what this semi-developed 
nation could afford to

The result was a 1675 
inflation rate near 1,000 
percent, and a halance- 
of-payments deficU of 
nearly 11 billion by the 
time the military took 
over in March 1671

Martinez de Hoz, the 
only civilian member of 
the Cabinet, began a slow 
return to a (t m  market 
system, lowering tariffs 
to allow inefficient in- 
duatries to die a natural 
death and to increase 
com petitive spirit in 
those remaining, selling 
o f f  s t a t e - o w n e d  
businesses and freeing 
prices.
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It there such a th i^  at 
an all-purpose adhesive?

Not if you mean an 
adhesive that does the 
best pouible job in every 
instance regardleu of the 
type of material on which 
it it being used While 
there are tome adhesives 
for almost anything, you 
will find them excellent 
only in some cases, toao 
in others and poor in still 
others

The much-publicised 
c y a n o c r y l a t e s ,  f o r  
example ,  hold, acme 
materiala — at
metals and glau  — in an 
incred ib le  bond, but 
aren't at their best with 
porous materials such as 
wood and leather When 
used, only a drop it 
needed and. at the labels 
are required to state, 
mutt be used with great 
care ao that none gets on 
the skin.

A strong contender for 
the "alm ost" all-purpose 
adhesive is epoxy, but it 
isn 't the best seller 
because it It (airly ex­
pensive. It comet in two 
parts, one of which it the 
adhesive itself, one a 
hardening agent They 
mutt be mixed just 
before use While a 
strong, durable bond is 
produced within minutes 
after application, a wait 
of an hour or ao is 
required for the bond to 
become fully cured. The 
proper temperature for 
this union to reach 
maximum strenrih in ao 
abort a period of time Is 
a b o u t  75 d e g r e e s  
Fahrenheit

Mixing of the two parts 
should be done on a clean 
surface or In a paper cup 
which if free of wax I 
have found that the 
simplest way to handle 
this is to squeeze tome of 
the adhesive onto a piece 
of clean paper with no 
print on it, then tqueese 
out an equal amount of 
the hardener right next to 
it ( If you run one into the 
other Immediately, it it 
difficult to judge when 
the amounts are equal). I 
then use a wooden tooth-

Sick to mix the two, wait 
alf a minute and then 

apply the mixture to both 
of the surfaces to be 
joined. Only a thin layer 
It required, after which 
the surfaces arc put

Coffee
'disaster'
forecast
Agence Franee-Pressc

SAN SALVADOR. El 
Salvador — The 1677-7g 
coffee crop in El Salvador 
and o t h e r  C en tr a l  
American countries will 
be ‘ ‘ d isastrous." the 
director of the National 
Coffee Company, Ricardo 
Falla, said here this

He said the El Salvador 
crop in 1677-71 would be 
about 1.6 milliofl bags, a 
million fewer than in the 
previous coffee year 

Falla said the counuy't 
economy would not be 
strongly affected by the 
poor coffee crop, since El 
Salvador had adequate 
reaervet to meet world 
demand He did not 
reveal the level of the cof­
fee reaervet or the 
reasons for hit prediction 
of a sharply lower crop In 
the current coffee year.

together at once. Moat of 
the time I find the tooth- 
p i c k  an e x c e l l e n t  
spreader

The first time you use 
an epoxy, you will have a 
tendency to squeeze out 
more of the adhesive and 
the hardener than you 
need for a tingle ap­
plication Try not to do so, 
because the mixture 
cannot be saved

E p o x y  a d h e s i v e s  
handle such materials at 
metals, glass, plastics, 
c e ram ic s  and wood, 
among others, and can be 
used to repair china, 
ovenware and anything 
that com et into contact 
with water and heat, 
since it is both waterproof 
and heatproof Another 
good feature it that it hat 
excel lent  void-fil ling 
properties for joining 
parts with uneven mating

surfaces
There are numerous 

other quality adhesives, 
including the white glues, 
the clear plastic cements, 
the rubber or neoprene- 
b a ttd  m astics, the 
contact cements, the 
metal menders, the many 
wood bonders and doient 
of specialty adhesives

While the multiplicity

of adhesives on the 
market la likely to be 
confusing, make H a point 
to road the label before 
you buy to aee If the 
product ftta your need Be 
c e r t a i n  t h e  l a b e l  
specifically mentions the 
material you will be 
working on The absence 
of such mention can be 
significant.
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MIDLAND COUNTY HISTORICAL 
Muaeum -> Opon 11 a.m. to 5 p.m. 
Monday through Thuraday and ta .m 
to noon and 1 to 4 p.m Saturday u  tfc« 
baaement of the Midland County 
Llorary. 301 W. Miaaouri Ave.

THE MICHKNER GALLERY of 
The Univeratty of Ttxaa (Auatin) ta 
preaentlng "Ameriran Maatera In the 
weat,** an exhibition of more than 10 
palntinga from the Phillip AnachuU 
colloctioo of Weater art of Denver. 
The Bhow will be on view through Feb

AN EXHIBITION. *4* x S . An In- 
atallation of Forma”  by Barry 
Phlllpa of Odeaia College, ia on 
diaplay In the art gallery of The 
Univeralty of Texaa of the Permian 
Baain.

AMON CARTER Muaeum of 
R'eatem Art (Fort Worth) haa opened 
a retroapective exhibition of the 
wort of famed American artiat Ben 
thahn (lIM -lN g). The diaplay will be 
•n view through Jan. IS. Itra

MENDOZA TRAIL MUSEUM ann 
Adrian House (MeCamey) — Con­
tains mementos of the late frontier, 
ranchinx and oil induatry as well as a. 
fossil collection and tape recordings

H B R IT A O l M USEUM  (B ig  
Spring) baa opened Us new core 
t x h ^ .  Museum is located at Sixth 
and Scurry atreeti

wrm MUSEUM 'San Antonio) is 
presenting a dual show. “ Sights 
West.”  featuring historic firearms 
from the Winchester Muaeum, and an 
exhibition of paintings and sculplbre 
by famous Western artiat Frederic 
Remington

MUSEUM OF THE SOUTHWEST 
(Midland), 1705 W. Missouri Ave., is 
exhibiting paintings from the exten­
sive Anacbuti collection of Denver, in­
cluding works by Catlin. Couse. 
Davey, Remington. Dasburg, Rlst- 
tram, Phillips and other masters of 
Western realism The show is free to 
the public between 10 a m and 5 p m 
weekdays, and from 2 to 5 p m Sun­
days

T A Y L O R  B R O W N - S A R A H  
DORSEY HOUSE (Midland) -  
Midland's oidest home la open 3 to S 
p.m. Sunday afternoons and by ap­
pointment by dialing M2-2kJl 
Located at 213 WeatheyfaH St.

THE h a n g in g  t r e e  GALLERY 
currently previewing wildlife art by 
James Harvey Johnson, a former 
Midland resident, and Richard 
Britton of Worcestershire. England 
The exhibit, which can be seen Sun­
day from 2 to 4 p m., will continue 
through December Located at 3201 N 
Big Spring St., the gallery Is open 
from 10 a m. to 0 p m Monday 
through Friday, and 11 a m to 4 p m. 
Satur^y.

N I T A  S T E W A R T  H A L E Y  
M e m o r i a l  Library  (Midland )  
currently is featuring a display of 
Indian blankets The museum la open 
• a.m. to S p m Monday through 
Friday at 1105 W Indiana St. SPORTS

THE PRESIDENTIAL MUSEUM
(fOdesaa) is featuring “ Prestdents of 
the Republic of Texas.”  “ Presidential 
Firsts”  and the monthly cartoon 
exhibit through early December The 
anuaeum is located at Seventh and Lee 
atreeta and hours are 0 a m to 5 p m. 
Monday through Saturday Admiasloo 
isfree. I

HIGH SCHOOL BASKETBALL -  
Hobbs at Midland Lee, a pm . 
Tuesday

Snyder at Midland High. 8 p m., 
Thursday

Plainview at Midland Lee, 8 p m .  
Friday

RANKIN MUSEUM -  Featuring
memorabilia from the community's
and Upton County's past. Open 3 to 5 

m. weekdays Located at Fifth and

GIRLS BASKETBALL -  Andrews 
at Lee, Midland at Klondike. Monday

&aln streets near the old Santa Fe 
Railway dep(4.

Lee at Sands. Snyder at Midland. 
Tuesday

PERMIAN BASIN PETROLEUM 
Museum, Library and Hall of Fame* 
(Midland) — O ^  f  a m to 5 p m

MIDLAND WOMAN’S CLUB will 
host a Shoppers' Luncheon from 11 
a.m. to 2 p m Friday at the Hogan 
Park Ciubhouae. The public is 
welcome

CHILDREN'S STORY HOUR, 
sponsored by the Junior League of 
Midland. Inc., and the Midland 
County Library, has cancelled ac­
tivities through Dec 29 due to 
Christmas vacation Story Hour will 
resume on Jan. 5.

LONE STAR BALLET (Amarillo) 
continues performances of its seventh 
annual production of “ The Nut­
cracker”  at 8 p m. today and Monday 
in Tascosa High School auditorium.

A WEST TEXAS YO-YO tour­
nament will be held from 1 to 3 p.m. 
today at the Midland Central YMCA 
The event is open to both members 
and non-members. Judging will be 
Michael Steele, Duncan yo-yo 
professional.

M A R I A N  B L A K E M O R E  
PLANETARIUM will feature a 
program. “ Star of Bethlehem." at 
7:30 p m. Monday through Thursday 
in addition to its regular presen­
tations. The (Christmas program is 
open to the public free of charge 
Located at 1705 W Missouri Ave.

HAYLOFT DINNER THEATRE 
(Lubbock) currently is featuring 
“ CTiarley’ s Aunt.”  the story of a 
young man who pretends he is a 
wealthy lady

THE MANSION dinner theater 
(Odessa) continues the musical 
production “ I Do. I Do”  featuring 
former Miss America Laurie Lea 
Schaefer. Performances are at 8:30 
p.m. Tuesday through Saturday and 
at 2:30 p m . Sundays.

"A  CHILD’S DREAM of Christ­
mas.”  Permian Playhouse's holiday 
production for young people, con­
tinues at 2:30 p m. today, with a final 
presentation at 2:30 p.m Sunday The 
Playhouse is located at 310 w 42nd 
St.. Odessa.

CASA MANANA (Fort Worth) 
today concludes “ Rudolph the Red- 
Nose Reindeer.”  a dramatiiation of 
the popular Christmas song

R N G H TU FE

C H A R O L AI S  R E S T A U R A N T  
(Midland) — Pamela Hahn appears 
every Thursday, Friday and Saturday 
night. Performance time is 7:40 p m 
Lwated in the Midland Hilton

LUSTY LADY ( Midland i — 
Jeannie Williams performing nightly 
from 9 p m  to 1 a m Located in the 
Holidsy Inn

• Vtjp'

THE GLOBE o( the Great South­
west (Odessa) today concludes 
Shakespeare's “ Romeo and Juliet”  as 
its final production of the 1977 season

A CHRISTMAS TOAST is offered by Bob Cratchit 
and his children in this scene in “ A Christmas 
C a ro l."  The dramatization o f Cliarles Dickens' 
c la ssic story will be presented by Midland Com­
munity Theatre at 10:30 a.m . apd 2:30 p.m. today, 
and 2:30 and 7:30 p m . Sunday in Theatre Centre.

2301 W. Indiana Ave. Jim W alker is seen as Crat- 
ch it and the children are, from left. Susannah 
K endrick as Elizabeth. Dean Hammond as Peter, 
Brenda W oods as Martha. J. J. Baskin as Tiny Tim 
and Stacy Rhodes as Belinda. (Staff Photo)

CLUB GRANADA (Midland) — 
“ Sagebrush”  will perform nightly at 
8:30 p m Open from 3 p m. to 2 a.m., 
the club is located at 3312 W. Wall St

BEST WESTERN (Midland) -  
Marty Montez performing from 8:30 
p m. to 12:30 a m Tuesday through 
Saturday. Located at Interstate 20 
West.

DISCOVERY LOUNGE (Midland) 
— “ Enterprise" performs for the last 
time tonight, with “ Multi Band”  
opening Monday. Performance time 
is 9 p.m. Located in the Midland 
Hilton.

ODESSA

THE PUB (Midland) — Scotty 
Hopkins performing at 8:30 p.m 
Located in the Sheraton Inn.

C O D Y  CATTLE COM PANY  
(Odessa) — Joseph Brunelle makes a 
final appearance tonight, with Mike 
Williams opening Tuesday. Per­
formances begin at 9 p m. Located at 
Santa Fe Square.

WINWOOD — “ Oh, God," (PG). 
Cinema I; “ Fantastic Invasion of 
Planet Earth," (PG), Cinema II. 
Starting Wednesday: “ Close En­
counters of the Third Kind,”  (PG), 
Cinema II.

SCOTT -  "Pete’s Dragon." (G). 
Cinema I: “ Telefon." (PG). Cinema 
II; “ The Bad News Bears in Breaking 
Training.”  (PG), Cinema III

MONDAY
“ CHORALE DA CAMERA.”  a 18- 

member vocal group within the 
chorale of the Midland-Odessa 
Symphony, .will present madrigal 
dinners at 7:30 p m Sunday in 
Odessa's Inn of the Golden West, and 
at 7:30 p m Monday in the Midland 
Hilton

ECTOR—“ Where’s Willie.”  (G). 
Starting Wednesday: “ The Gaunt­
let." (R).

Midland Planning and Zoning 
Commiuion. 4 p.m., council cham­
ber. city hall.

Howard County Commissioners 
Court, 9 a.m., courthouse

Lamesa School Board, 7:30 p.m., 
Lamesa High School library.

Forsan School Board, 7 p.m., 
Forsan High School board room.

GRANDVIEW -  “ Bobby Deer­
field.”  (R).  Starting Wednesday: 
“ Saturday Night Fever," (R).

MIDLAND

iOATES T o l 
lE iw iin

TUESDAY HODGE — “ The Last Remake of 
Beau Geste,”  (PG). Screen 2.

Midland board of Adjustment. 1:30 
p.m., council chamber, city hall.

MIDLAND PUBLIC SCHOOL 
children will be dismissed for the 
Christmas holidays at the end of the 
school day Thursday. Classes will 
resume Jan. 3.1978

WEDNESDAY
WESTWOOD -  “ The Demon 

S eed ,"(R ).

Midland Parks and Recreation 
Commission, 3 p.m., conference 
room, city hall.

CINEMA 1 — “ The Island of Dr. 
Moreau.”  (PG).

C LU B
M E r n N C S

TODAY
TUESDAY

Midland Cliapter No 3? "iwenU Without Partners. 2:30 
p m . Midland Communit -atre Centre 

Midland Chapter No. . Without Partners. S
p m ,  1011W Storey St

Overeaters Anonymous. 10 am., St Paul United 
Methodist Church

SUNDAY

Midland Cliapter No 32. Parents Without Partners. 3 
p m .,3310W DengarSt

Greater Permian Basin Duplicate Bridge Unit No 2M, 
1 :30p m . Knights of Cotumbus Hall

MONDAY

/

A LO FT Y  SYM BOL of the aeaaod's glitter, this lO-foot Christmis 
tree will remain lighted through the holidays in Midlaffd’e O i e r  
P irk , 1300 W. Will St. The tree is constructed from a SO-foot 
aluminum pole and 300 4ree'branches ranging from five to 10 feet 
in length. (Staff Photo) ;• ■ I ‘  ̂■ f ‘

Midland Cliapter, Ameriran Asaoriation of Retired 
Peraons. 830 pm .. Fellowship Hall. First Ch(istian 
Church.

Midlaad Assembly No 193. Order of the Rainbow for 
Qlrit, 7 p.m . Masonic Temple .
1 Midland Camera Club. 7:30p m . Planetsrium 
j Christian Women's Hub. noon. Conner's Bsnquet Room 

Midland Chapter No 32. Parents Witlwut Psrtners, X 
p m . 2809 Brunson St . ,

Midland Senior Center. 10 a m .drop in. 1 p m . ari.lsMe 
garnet. Firm Chriatiaa Chnrch 

Rebekih Lodge No. 91, S p m ,810 E Florida St 
Overeaten Anonymous. 7:30 pm.. St. Paul United. 

Methodist Church
, Midland (DowntoWn) KIwanis Oub. noon,\ Midland 
HUttm /

East Side Liona Club. 7:10pm ,F,I Rancho Grandd 
Wall Street Toastmasten. .7 p n|, Furr's Cafrieria

Midland RAPW Club. 7:30 p m . Midland Woman's Hub 
Norman Read Chapter No 1010, OES. I p m.. Masonic 

Temple
American Legion Auxiliary of Woods W Lynch Post No 

19,8p m . American Legion Hall 
Midland AAM Club. noon. Sans Souci Club 
American Association'of Critical Care Nurses. 7 p m ., 

MMH cafeteria
Midland Senior Center. 1:30 a m .. Mood preuure check: 

10 a m . stitchery; 1 p'm..liable games. First Christian 
Oiurch

Tuesday Dur -ate Bridge (Tub. 10 a m., Knights of 
Columbus Hall

Midland Palette (Tub. 9:30 a m..004 N Colorado St 
RHCC Women's Golf Association, la  m . club 
Texas O P S  Morning Chapter. 9 a m.. Christ 

Presbyten hurch i
Desert 18. Chapter. Sweet,Adelines, Inc.. 7:X  p m..

MCC Women's(k>tf Association, la  m.,club 
Midland Downtown Lions Gub. noon. Midland Hilton 
Terminal Uons (Tub. C lSp m . High Sky Restaurant 
Tall City Optimists. 1:30 a m.. Sambo's Restaurant 
Breakfast Optimist Club. 4:30 a m . Sambo's Restaurant. 
Midland CTiesaGub. 7p m.. Christ Presbyterian (Tiurch.

THURSDAY

First United 8-
Morning Lion.
Pop-U^Toastm
55-Plus Dance C

Sidland West R 
idland (Ti^pter, 

Branding Iron

dist Church 
b. 6 tSk m.. Green's Restaurant 
ert. S;30a m . Sambo's Restaurant 
1. 8p m , Tall City VFW Post No 7208 
ry (Tub. noon. Ramada Inn 

American Business (Tub. noon

Midland Senior Center, 1:30 a m., pleasure painters; 1 
'.m .. tames. First Christian (Tiurch.

'Texas Chapter No. 122, T O P S.. 7 p m., St. Paul United 
Meth^ist Church.

Recovery. Inc.. 7:30 p m.. Permian Basin Community 
Center (or Mental Health and Mental Retardation 

Overeaters Anonymous. 1:30 pm .. St Paul United 
Methodist (Tiurch

Kiwanis Gub of Midland Village, noon. Sheraton Inn 
Westaide Lions Gub. noon. Westside Lioni Den 
RoUryGubof Midland. 11:55a m.. Midland Hiltoh , 
Tall Town Toastmasters. S:15a m . Sambo's Restaurijig. 
Evening Lions Gbb, fc30 p.m.. Westside Lions Den. 
Permian ToastmasterS.Wbn. Metro Building 
Sun Country (>utlemen Barb^fshoppers. 8 p m., 1111 W 

WallSt. I ('■ ,  r

{

/ ■
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WEDNESDAY

Ladies AuxilUry to^Tall CKy VFW Pi^t No 7208.1 p 
“ FHalL ■' > '

'idiand Senior Centef. l l : «  a m , luncheon; 1 p m+
VFW Hall
' kfidiand Senior Centef. ILt 

table gamrs First (TiristianCnurch

.J\ > I if

FRIDAY ^
' -A

Midland Senior Center. 10 a m.. dh»p 4n: 1 p m., games. 
First Giristian Oiurcn

MCC Ladies' Association. 12:45p.ki. clubhouse 
Soothside UoUs Gub. noon. Soutbside Lions Club 

Building
Midland Jayceea. twon Western Siztlin' Steak House.
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AFC East title comes down to Colts, Pats
By HAL BOCK 
AP Sports Writer

“ Everybody figured it would come 
down to this," said Baltimore Coach 
Ted Marchibroda. “ Everybody 
figured that the race would go down 
to the very last Sunday and it has."

With one weekend remaining in 
the National Football League's 
regular season, three teams are tied 
for first place and a playoff berth in 
the American Conference East. 
Baltimore, New England and Miami 
all are 9-4 but, in the mysterious 
world of the NFL, the Colts’ 9-4 is 
better than the other two.

Ex-Bama 
aides lose 
appeal

NEW ORLEANS (AP) -  Two 
form er assistant coaches at the 
University of Alabama lost their 
appeal Friday of a ruling that upheld 
the National Collegiate Athletic 
Association's right to limit the 
number of coaches.

The 5th U S. Circuit Court of Ap­
peals said thatthe NCAA rule limiting 
football teams to eight assistant 
coaches and basketball teams to two 
was not unreasonable.

The ruling referred to a suit filed by 
Lawrence  Hennesey, assistant 
football coach at Alabama for 19 < 
years; and Wendell Hudson, Crimson 
Tide assistant basketball coach for 
two years.

The NCAA established the limits on 
the sizes of coaching staffs iri 1979. 
Because Hennessey and Hudson were 
on staffs that were larger than the 
NCAA allowed, they were made 
parttime coaches.

They filed suit against the rule in 
U.S. District Court in Alabama, but 
District Judge Sam Pointer upheld 
the NCAA's right to impose the rule 
on its voluntary members.

Russians defeat 
Quebec Nordiques

MOSCOW AP—The Soviet national 
hockey team posted a 5-3 victory over 
the (Quebec Nordiques of the World 
Hockey Association in the Izvestial 
Hockey Tournament Friday night.

The Soviet team took a 2-0 lead in 
the first period and went ahead 4-2 
after two stanzas.

In another match Fridlay,  
Czechoslovakia and Finland played a 
3-3 tie

MIAMI PLAYS Buffalo today 
and only by winning can the 
Dolphins keep their title hopes alive 
And if they win, the Dolphins would 
eliminate New England because of 
the complicated tie-break formula

The Patriots will play in Baltimore 
Sunday and when they take the field, 
they'll know if they're still alive. An 
upset by the Bills would keep them 
in business.

The Colts, meanwhile, are the only 
team of the three that can decide 
their own fate. If they beat New 
England Sunday, they're in. If they 
lose, they're out. It's as simple as 
that. Winning for the other two

teams might am be enough For 
Baltimore, it would be

In today's other games. Min- 
Bcaota. trying to nail down the NFC 
Central title, plays at Detroit and 
Los Angeles is at Washiagtoa. with 
the Redskins hoping for an NFC wild 
card berth

ON SUNDAY, it will be Cincinnati 
at Honstoo and Pittsburgh at San 
Diego with the AFC CenU^l crown 
on the line. Clrvclaod at Seattle. 
KansasCity at Oakland. Chicago at 
the New York Giants. New Orteans 
at AUnnu. St. Louis at Tampa Bay, 
Snn Fmneinco vs. Green Bay at

■ -rj

D E N V E R  BRONCOS Conch Red M iD cr.» .  cheers on his teem  In 
p ra ctice  as the AFC team prepares for Sunday's final regu lar 
season gam e with Dallas. (A P  Laserpboto)

Norton pilot colls AM 
bombshell just a ruse

NEW YORK (AP) -  Bob Biron, 
Ken Norton's manager, said Friday 
that, contrary to Muhammad All's 
bombshell announcement, he doesn't 
think the champion is ever going to 
fight Norton.

"It  isn't going to happen," he said, 
responding to All's statements 
Thursday that he had signed with 
promoter Bob Arum — for $12 
million — to fight Norton next 
September.

Biron, citing a World Boxing Coun­
cil edict calling for an Ali^orton 
bout no later than next May, threw a 
gigantic monkey wrench into Arum's

flans for the September bout — and 
e may have cost Arum tl25,(X)0 as 

well.

All's announcement jolted what 
was supposed to be a news con­
ference to promote his title bout 
against young Leon Spinks in Las 
Vegas, Nev., Feb. 15.

ARUM, OF Top Rank. Inc., also 
promoting the Spinks bout, said he 
only needs Norton's signature and 
that he has deposited $125,000 in a 
bank to serve as part of the purse. 
The money goes to All if Norton fails 
to sign by May 1.

“ I see no problems in getting Nor­
ton,”  Arum said. "I can't say that I 
have him, though, because I don't."

Regazzoni signs up 

with Shadow team

That’ s not what Biron said, 
though.

"It 's  just a ploy to get Ali some 
cheap fights,”  he said "Come 
September he’d either retire or 
claim he's hurt. Arum wants to get 
a couple of cheap fights for Ali to 
make money. Butch Lewis (one of 
Arum's assistants) kept that off in 
the release when he said. ‘We have 
Ali signed up for two more Tights

after Spinks ” *
BIRON anggested Anun and Ali 

dropped the boabaheil as a means of 
circuBveoting a promise Ali made 
to tte  WBC. in which be u id  he 
would not fight anyone after the 
Spinks bout that he would begin 
negotiating by mid-March for a boot 
against Nortan. that an agreement 
would be reached ne later than April 
5 and that the bout would be staged 
within •$ days of the agreement

TV, radio sports log
Today

PRO FOOTBALL -  Rams vs 
Redskins, noon. KOSA-TV.

Bills vs. Dolphins. 3 pm. ,  
KMID-TV

Vikings vs. Lkms. 8 pm.,  
KMOM-TV

Sunday
PRO FOOTBALL -  JeU vs 

Eagles, noon, KMID-TV.
^ a r s  vs. Giants, noon. KOSA, 

TV.
Cowboys vs Broncos. 3 p m..

KOSA-T\’
Monday

COLLEGE FOOTBALL -  
Nebraska vs North Carolina. 
Liberty Bowl. I p  m.. KMOM-TV

Thursday
COLLEGE f o o t b a l l  -  

Minnesota vs. vs Maryland. 7 
p m . KMOM-TV, Cable4

Friday
COLLEGE FOOTBALL —  

Texas Tech vs Florida State. 7 
p.m ..Cable4

Wisconsin hires Ball 
State's Dave McClain

Regazzoni, 
the racing world, hid been driving for 
the small British .Ensign team this 
yeair after leaving Ferrari.

In the Shadow team, run by Don 
NichoUs of Chicago, he will be part­
nered with ( ^ m in  Hans Stuck. The 
team is developing a new car which is 
expected to be ready for the South 
African face, according to aources 
clone to S^dow .

MADISON. Wis (AP) — Dave 
I McGain, who compiled a glittering 
46-25-3 record in seven seasons as 
head football coach at Ball State, 
liidianif was named head coach at the 
UniverMty of WiMoosin Friday

McGain. 31, succeeds John Jar- 
dine, who resigned Nov. 7 effective at 
the end of the 1977 season. The 
Badgers had only one wianing season 
in eight under Jardine, including 5-9 
this year.

M epain, 39, wai given a four-year 
contract the first year «  which caDa 
for a tnlary of $33,000. That is the 
name amount paM to Jardine this 
ye ir .

I •

Milwaukee, the New York JeU at 
Philadelphia and. in what could be a 
Super Bowl preview, Denver at 
Dalla«

The Colts created the threeway 
scramble by losing to Detroit last 
Sunday on a blocked punt witb nine 
seconds left in the game Bnt that 
loss actually did more damage to 
New England, which whipped Miami 
last week, than it did to Baltimore

By losmg last week, the Colts kept 
Miami alive Had the Cotta won. 
Miami would have been eliminated 
and the winner of Sunday's game

Wiaconsin Athletic Director Elroy 
Hirsch had received more than to 
applicationt for Uie joh and said he 
personally interviewed 14 of them.

‘T m  very happy the search is 
over,”  Hirsch said “ I apologize for 
taking an much time, bnt we had s 
lot of fine applicanU Dave stood edt 

' very w«U "M ePain. whoae State 
teams hM records of 9-2,1-3 and 9-2 
the lait three yean. saM he was 
denuded  In he selected. He u id  
W iacM sin 's excellent academic 
repwlatioa ihoald be an asact in 
recruiting.

McClair- said he expects to have his 
new itr If chasen by Chriatmas.

b etw een  B altim ore aad New 
England would have become the 
AFC Eaet champion <the Colu by 
virtue at a better nverall record or 
the PatrtoU by virtne at a eeaten 
sweep of the twe gaeses against 
Battimorei

NOW. MUMPS invelvemem com 
plicates the matter, hnt only for New 
England The F au  still could win 
Sunday, of conree. hnt ualees the 
Dolphins lone, that victory would be 
m eaniagleu

The AFC Central rare similiarly is 
confused

Both Cinchmati and Pittsburgh 
carry t d  records into their final 
games but the Bengals' 9-S includes 
a hidden edee

If both teams win their final

Samet, nocinnati would take the 
iviaion because of a onepoint edge 

in point differentials between the two 
teams But should both teams loae 
Simday. the divlskm record tie­
breaker would apply and the 
Steelers would get in

Now, if you understand all of that, 
would you like to hear about Eina- 
tein'a theory at relativity*

Rams may be Allen s 
last game with Redskins
By LEONARD SHAPIRO 
The Washington Post

W AS H IN G T O N  -  For  the 
Washington Redskins, it comes down 
to one game, several ifs and one in­
triguing question- will (George Allen 
be making his final appearance as 
the team's bead coach today agaiaat 
the Los Angeles Rams*

Allen, wte still has not signed that 
four-year extenskm to his contract, 
aaid Friday, “ I think not. I hope 
not”  when asked if Saturday's 1 p m 
affair would be his last home game 
as coach of the Redskins

It's my declskm. I felt it wasn't 
that im portant. Whatever the 
details, my attorney can work tt enl 
with the Redskins I hate to even 
think about it because it isn't that 
important The moet important thing 
is to play good football and to win 
So I'm not thinking that way (that he 
wUI not be here in 1977 "

Does that mean he plans to return 
in 1971*

"Yeah, we like it here.”  he said 
‘T m  proud of our team I like onr 
organizatkM. I like our players aad 1 
like my staff They've worked hard 
and done a go6d job

*TT JUST happened to tarn nut 
this way When your attorney recom­
mends not to sijgn until a couple of 
legal things are straightened eul ... 
So if you have an attorney, you've 
gotta* go by him ... this to me should 
be the last thing at the bottom of 
your article ”

And yet. Allen's fntare la 
Waihington seems inexoraUy tied to 
the outcome of today’s game agaiuat 
the NFC Western DivisiM champtou 
Rama, as weli at games involviag 
the Minnesota Vikings and Chkago 
Bears in the following 24 hours

If the Redskins can slip into the 
playoffs — and all manner of com­
binations can make that happen — 
Allen's posttkM obviously wonld be 
strengthened when the mech. his at­
torney, Ed Hookatratten of Lm  
Angeles, and team president Edward 
Bennett Williams conthrae negoUa- 
*.ioos

Hookatratten and Williams have 
chosen not to comment on ABcn't 
contract proMems in recent months, 
though NFL aources couUnue to say 
the impaaae it baaed almost totally 
on financial control of the fbothoD 
operatioa

Allen wants more, those sources 
say, and Williams apparently is un­
willing to yield

" I  DON’T think anyone reaHy 
knows what’s going to happen.”  tight 
end Jean Fugett said “ Yon bear aD 
the talk, some of the guys say he's

Solng, other guys say be'a staytng I 
o know this, nobody's talking about 

winning this game for the Gipper or 
anything like that. We just know 
w e've got to win it to keep 
breathing "

A Redskin victory gnarsntees 
nothing, of course, becense if the 
Vikings defeat Detroit Saturday 
night and Chicago downs the Giants 
S t^ a y . the Rcoskina will celebrate 
(Thristmaa at home 

The oddsmakers say the Rams will 
prevail by four.

If the Redskins do manage to at­
tain the wild-card berth, their 
opening-round opponent would be the 
Rams, hi Los Angeles, on Dec. 2$ 
and that leaves another intriguing 
question about Saturday's affair 

Will the Rams go all out. knowing 
t h e y  c o u ld  f a c e  this s am e  
Washington bunch a week from 
now* Or will they rest injured 
players, stay basic and do just 
enough to win. or at least avoid get­
ting embarrataed*

THE RAMS alio srould seem to 
benefit if the Redskins do make the 
playoffs. It seems likely Los Angelps 
w o^d prefer to play a WaahingUto 
team that has struggled all year on 
offense, rather than a Giicago team 
that features the game's most 
devastating runner. Walter Payton 

The Rams have been insisting aOf 
week they do not intend to roil ever. 
“ We’ve got a lot of pride, and we'd 
lilm to keep our momentum going in- 
to\thc playofft," u M  Ram center 
Rich Saul, the twin brother of Red­
skin offensive guard Ren Saul.

"Sure I’d U if to see my brother 
Make the playofia. But he knows I'm

i

going
field.

all enl when I'm out ou the 
and so win everyone clac on 

our team That's a promise "
"It 's  a hard game to figure out." 

Allen admitted Friday after his 
fourth closed practice of the week 
"T h ii is probably the best overall 
Ram team in the last five years 

"They have mere stability at 
quarterback. Pat Haden’ s done an 
outotaading joh They have more 
spread aU the way aronnd. and their 
defenne. I helirve. la No 1 in poinU 
allowed in the leagne "

Actually, the Rams have' given up 
seven more pointo. 129 then the NFL- 
leading Atlanta Falcnns Bui L A 
has hiMt alatlalical

the Redakint in almost every often- 
Nve and defensive category

The Rams average 339 yards of of- 
•fenae, the Redskins 299 they have 
scored M tourhdowna this ataaon, 
t ^  Redskins 17 They have held op­
ponents to an average of 299 yards 
per game, the Redakins have yielded 
an average of 294

HADEN LEADB the NFL In pass­
ing with a 99 7 completion average. 
11 touchdown toases and five in- 
torcepttons Running back Lawrence 
McCutcheoo. who probably will atari 
but not play the eotlre game, 
already has rushed for a team- 
record LZ19 yards.

V

N O T A L L  o f the DaDas Cowboys ebeerlesdcrs are native Texana. 
T a m i B arber originally hailed from  Omaha, but is now a private 
aecretary  in Arlington With 14 years o f ballet and six years o f  Jaxx 
dancing, she 's well-qualified. (Staff photo)

Schoolboy grid titles 
go up for grabs today
By The Aaoaciatod Fraaa

Two achoolhey teams with adjoin­
ing boundaries and Cinderella 
dreams go after coveted state Ugh 
school footbon Utles today agataul 
unbeaten, topranked opposition

The Plano WUdeaU. who get to the 
playofft after a referees’ mi$up ovet 
penetrations in a regular aeSaon tie 
with powerful Sherman, tangle oith 
the No l^raaked Port Neches-Grovoa 
Indians today afternoon in Irving's 
Texas StadUm fnr the Gass 4A 
champtewhlp. '

IfeanwhSe u '  Woco. the Wylie 
Pirates, whoae achooi dietrkt bonn- 
darica adjoia Plaao. Ucfcle BeUville, 
the topraaked team in Class 2A, for 
the c m  title.

In the Claes A fiaals. East Bernard 
takes en Seagraves this afternoon in
Brqwnwood.

n e  in id ca u . who tied

1

Shermao

14-14 and won a playoff berth on first 
downs after referees mistakenly 
deprived Sherman of a penetration, 
could become the first high Khool 
team to win the Gasa 2A, 3A and 4A 
crowns.

The growing Dallas suburb has 
moved throu^ the ranks steadily 
and ia making Its first trip to t ^  
Gasa 4A finals. The Wildcats edgsd 
unbeaten Odessa Permian 3-9 laat 
week

The Indians, who won the State 4A 
title In 1975 have won 39 of their laat 
40 games. Including all 14 this 
■eaaon. They bruited San Antonio 

,L e« 19411m  week
The 2;39 p m meeting is expected 

to draw a crowd of about 49,999. T V  
all-time high school record is 4 S M  
set in the Cotton Bowl in 1949.

Plano tost Its aeaaon aganer to
Suulh Garland and also rallied from 
a 2M>deficit in the quaitor-ftnalt to 
edge Daltos^lghland f  arfe |^39.

/ .
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When DaUas and Denver meet at 
Texaa Stadium Sunday, it will be the 
No 1 defense against the No 1 of­
fense

Denver not only hoasts the best 
record in pro football this season, with 
one game to go. but the Broncos show 
the best defense against the rush in 
the American Conference 

Dallas, which can tie Denver for the 
best record in pro footbali by beating 
the Broncos Sunday, possesses the 
top^anked offense 

Denver's defense is backed by

four exceptionally quick linebackers 
and rivals have found it impossible to 
go outside against the famed Orange 
Crush

That's okay with Dallas Coach Tom 
Landry ,  who said after the 
Philadelphia game that if "you are 
going to beat anybody, you are going 
to have to beat them up the middle."
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THE GUYS the Dallas offense will 
have to handle to win are end Lyle 
Aisado, linebackers Randy Gran- 
dlahar, Tom Jackson, comerbacks

Steve Foley and Louis Wright and 
safety Bill Thompson They put the 
squeere in the Crush defense. 
OFFENSIVELY. DENVER is a 

team that relies on its defense to 
irovide field position, which sounds 

te a long, established Dallas 
tradition.

Quarterback Craig Morton has been 
the comeback story of the AFC and 
this will be his first opportunity to 
play his oM teammates as a member

pro
like

of a winning team.
Tight end Riley Odoms is Morton's
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B altim ore 's  Bert Jones (7 ) discovers Denver’ s 
O range Crush defem se is aptly named as lineman

L yle  Aisado puts the sack on the Colts’ quar­
terback . (A P  Laserphoto)

favorite receiver.
Another ex-Cowboy is running back 

Jim Jensen, traded to Denver early 
this year. "I 'll be all psyched up, but I 
don't feel I have anything to prove. 
I'm playing against the team, not the 
factor that took me out ot Dallas. I'm 
just looking forward to a good game. 
I’ve got a lot of friends back there."

Morton’s feelings* "I  don’t know 
how I feel about Dallas. I haven't 
thought about Dallas.."

StiU. there must be memories for 
Craig, who quarterbacked Dallas to 
the Super Bowl In 1970 where the 
Cowboys lost to Baltimore 16-13 as 
some labeled the former California 
star "the worst passing quarterback" 
to play in the Super Bowl.

MORTON BEGAN the 1971 season 
as No. 1. but Staubach was tired of 
waiting in the wings and running back 
Calvin Hill took note of Roger’s 
business-like determination. “ Let's 
just say I'm glad Roger isn't running 
second string at my position."

By the opening of the season. 
Morton and Staubach were alter­
nating at quarterback. But Landry 
soon opted for Staubach and it paid off 
with 10 straight victories.

The following summer. Staubach 
hurt his shoulder and Morton took 
over. The team made the playoffs, but 
many felt it was despite Craig and not 
because of him. Most overlooked five 
touchdown passes dropped by 
teammates during the season.

That was the year that Staubach 
produced the miracle rally of 17 
points in the final six minutes to beat 
San Francisco in the playoffs. 30-26.

Staubach relieved Morton in the 
third quarter of that game snd with 
his performance regained his No. 1 
role. Strangely enough. Morton, the 
following Wednesday, was named the 
winner of the Most Popular Cowboy 
contest.

Morton was finally traded to the 
Giants in 1974 where he languished in 
the futility of a losing team. He 
became popular in New York to 
blame Craig when things went wrong.

But Denver appointed Red Miller 
coach and Red recalled the words of 
Dallas scout Red Hickey, who ob­
served of Craig. “ One of these days 
somebody Is going to figure out there 
aren't many quarterbacks who have 
taken a team to the Super Bowl. The 
guy that figures it out may get himself 
a championship.” ...enter Miller.
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Curto denied ring license
BOSTON A P - M i d -  

dWweight boxer Vlante 
Curio i t  Boetou. arho rsB 
outoaaSept Mboutwith 
M a r v i n  H a g i t r  o f  
BreckUu. Maaa, hat 
been denied retam of hit 
boxtaig llreuse by the 
M a s s a c h i s e l t s  Boxing 
romnilaalon 

T h e  p a n e l  vo te d  
unanimoualy ‘nmraday to 
deny Curio's appeal after 
he rtourfoced 19 days

ago
Curio, who had been In 

Seattle, said he ran away 
three days before the 
achedttled Hagler fight 
because of unspecified 
personal problems

J h r jM T ^  I «p« mm m 4̂m

ktgmOm 0
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Despite his recent slump. Dallas 
C o w b o y s '  quarterback  Roger  
Staubach ranks No 2 overall in 
passing efficiency going into the final 
weekend of the National Football 
League season

Roger's rating It IS 9. which it 
second only to the 90 4 of Los Angeles' 
Pat Haden That includes both the 
American and National conferences 

Ratings are baaed on percentage of 
completions, average yards per pau. 
percentage of passes for touchdowns 
and percentage of interceptions 

Tbe relation of his standing in 
each caregory in to other quarter­
backs determines his rating. For ex­
ample. Staubach in the NFC is se­
cond in percentage of completions 
with a S7 2 to Haden's S6 7 In 
average yards per gained per pau. 
Roger ia third at 7.21 to Haden's 
leading 7 S7 and Jim Hart's 7.30 

In percentage of touchdowns on 
passes. Staubach is third with 4 7 
while Haden again leads with S 6 and 
Philadelphia's Ron Jaworski is 
second at 5 S, although his total rating 
of 39 2 places him 10th in the leagiie 

In percentage of interre^ions. 
Staubach Is first with only 2.3 while 
Haden is second at 2 6 and 
Washington’s Bill Kilmer is third irith 
28

TfO SATTLeS

f£ME.
It should be noted that Staubach has 

faced more exposure than Haden. 
passing 341 times to 196 for Haden. 
who didn't replace Joe Namath until 
after the fifth game 

For those interested in the Morton- 
Staubach match up Sunday. Craig is 
second in the AFC with an 82.0 behind 
the 85.1 of Miami's Bob Griese.

Morton's percentages are 51.8 
completions. 7.82 average yards 
gained. 55 touchdowns, and 3.2 in­
terceptions

can expect to go, even if Walter 
Payton of Chicago and Lawrence 
McCutcheon of Los Angeles don't gain 
8 yard this week Payton is shooting 
for a record at 1,805 yards and Mc­
Cutcheon 8 solid, but distant second at 
1,213 yards

Over in the AFC, Oakland's Mark 
Van Feghen leads at 1,202 yards with 
Franco Harris of Pittsburgh at 1,147 
and Baltimore's Lydell Mitchell at 
1,076 yards Only Gregg Pruitt of 
Cleveland (958) and Sam Cun­
ningham. New England, (949) are 
within reach ofl.OOO yards

So if Dorsett makes it. he'll be in 
select company and will have the 
added distinction of being either 
conference’ s only 1,000-yard rusher 
who started the season aa a bench-
warmer.

MORE FODDER for Dallas-Denver 
Sunday... Dallas ranks first in NFC

offense and second in overall defense. 
The Cowboys are second in pauing 
offense and third in rushing The 
Bears, naturally, lead the latter.

Defensively, Dallas is first against 
the rush and fourth against the pau

Denver.meanwhile, ranks 11th in 
overall offense and third in defense. 
The Bnmeos are sixth in rushing and, 
despice Morton's comeback. 12th in 
pauing.

Defensively, the Broncos are first 
against the rush and 12th against the 
pau , loosen up that arm, Roger.

However, when it comes to scoring 
differential, which is after all B-here it 
is at, Denver is No 1 in the AFC and 
Dallas is second to Los Angeles in che 
NFC.

Now if you want to go out and place 
your money on Sunday's qame, y tt  
can do it with facts slid fiqures at your 
disposal Betcha still come home with 
an empty wallet

MEANWHILE, TONY Dorsett. who 
was eighth in NFC rushing two weeks 
ago, has moved up to third with 957 
vards going into Sunday's game and if 
he can squeeze through the Orange 
Cnuh defense for 44 yards, be'II 
surpass that magical 1.000-yard 
barrier

Third is shout as high as the rookie

Rangers
defeat
Grandfalls

Curto was ranked in the 
middiwelght division's 
top 10 before his depar­
ture and Bsk) he was 
unable to earn a living ex­
cept ia boxing
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Red Raiders suffer

k B? M  8 first cage setback
Oakland squares off
for fight with Denver

P O L O R A b O  getting his major league 
tP R lH G t. Cpio. (AF) — bsaeball franchise ap- 
OUm m  Marvin Davis proved by the American 
should bare IRUe trouble ipsgue If a t35 million

"I  think It frill be ap-

[iroved 100 per cent if the 
■wsuit Is taken care of." 

said Calvin Griffith, who

otiTaiu  
M O  PUNT
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•uH blocking the move ia hat been president and 
sHtied, according to a general m auger of the
survey of 10 AL teams 

The survey, conducted
f * 'Minnesota 
lISS and

Twins since 
is American

KNOXVILLE. Tenn ( AP i -  Utah's 
junior forward Greg Deane came 
alive with 10 second-half points 
Friday night to hand Texas Tech its 
first lo u  of the season. 68-62, in the 
opening game of the Volunteer 
Classic college basketball tour­
nament

Deane scored four field goals and a 
pair of free throws in the final period 
aa the Utes overcame a full-court 
press by Texas Tech Deane finished 
the game as Utah's leading Korer 
with 18.

Host Tennessee met Dartmouth in 
the second preliminary game of the

four-team tourney 
The victory advanced Utah's record 

to 4-1 stkI placed Tech at 5-1 
Utah jumped out in front early, but 

the lead exchanged hands four times 
in the first half
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G R A N D F A L L S  —  
Greenwood raised its 
basketball record to 15-2 
by defeating Grandfalli. 
95-72, here Friday night 

G o r d o n  W i l l i a m s  
scored 25 points for the 
Rangers while Lawrence 
Swafford had 19, Joe 
Mobley 17 and Vondell 
Woolfolk 10. Joe Reynolds 
led Grandfalls with 31 
while Acosta had 17.

In the boys JV game. 
Greenwood won 58-49 

Ihe girls varsity raised 
its record to 6-11 with an 
89-11 win as Jennie An­
derson scored 28 and 
Alecia Collins 27 Jena 
Mobley pitched in 18 For 
G r a n d f a l l s ,  M a r ia  
Vasquez had 20 and Carla 
Vasquez 7.

OB-E «B m m  
(I

TwEktik Wm «-

by the Colorado Springs League vice president 
G aze tt e -T e le g raph ,  "It 's  a good idea to get 
shows they srouid likely out of the Bay area 
approve the transaction because it'a been costing 
once legal knots are us money every time we 
untied. Ten clubs must go to Oakland.”  Griffith 
approve the shift said. "W e don’t meet our

'Three team officials expenses when we go to 
were unavailahie for play the A 's." 
comment, and the 14th

Bulldogs, Rebels lose
UH downs 
Xavier U.

' V i

U N M I S T A K A B L Y
L E V r S ’

tournament contests
club Is Oakland itself.

p6 r  r t n t
(29t8 « .  RmruciT n . w u n o w  co.) 
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Joe Burke, general 
manager of the Western 
D i v i s i o n  c h a m p i o n  
Kansas CHy Royals, uk) 
he la etpeclally pleased 
with the sale.

\ "There was DO love lost 
when Charlie Finley took 
the A 't out of I Kanaas 

/C ity ," he said "There’s 
I been a lot of talk about 
the deal here. I don't see 
any objectiona to Denver, 
but we have to be careful 
about '  beihg too en- 
Uufaioatk odtil the legal . 
matters are aetUed."

The Tall CTty'a touring basketball 
took their lumps in Friday 

toumsment jousting, both 
one-sided defeats.

....JIand Lee lost to San Antonio 
Highlands. 7342, in the San Antonio 
Toumajmotrt and will play Akatln 
Johnston in a consolation qai 
11:30 a.m today.

It was the third tournament l

the Rebels in the last two weeks 
Midland High suffered Ht second 

atralght setback in the Wichita Fails 
Tournament, losing 85-51 to Dallas 
Skyline That puts Midland in the 
battle for last place with Wichita 
Falls Hirschi at 9; 30 a m today

Brodley sparks
EL PASO, 'Texas (AP) — Junior 

forward James Brgdley hit 25 points 
Friday night to spdili Memphis State 
to a 71-45 .victory over Texat-EI Paso 
tn  ̂ a first-round game In the Suh 
Carnival Baaketbau n a u ir

JOE GARNER had 16 points in 
Lee's lots to San Antonio Highlands 
while Emeat Merritt. Dave Stueckler 
and Mike Oestmann each had 12.

AI Wichita Falla. Jeff Sanders led 
Midland with 16 points and Cliff 
N kkey ae.ored IS. However, the 
motivator behind Skyline’s srin was 
Gregory Jeter, irho pumped in 23 
points.

HOUSTON (AP) _  
Houston rode the bail- 
hawking defense of Ken 
Ciolli and a 25-point 
performance by Cecile 
Rose to a 100-75 victory 
Friday night over Xavier 
University in a first 
round game of the 18th 
a n n u a l  B l u e b o n n e t  
Baaketball O a u ic  

North Texas met Rke 
in the second first-round 
game. The uinners will 
meet Saturday for the 
tournament title.unsa(ni
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G<xxl-l0(3king. hard wear­
ing Levi s* Movin O n " bib 

I  overalls Fashionably slim 
-  and gently flared with ad- 
I lustable straps for perfect 
comfort and fit Traditional 

! Levis* detailing Levi s* 
genuine quality buitt into 

I every pair In pre-washed 
1 denim or corc^uroy
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UT loss left Orange Bov/l-bound Hogs at crossroads
FAYETTEVILLE. Ark (AP) -  

The Arkansas football team was at a 
crouroads.

The Raiorbacks had won their first 
four games easily before losing a gut- 
wrenching 13-9 decision to Texas.

"Our football team could have gone 
either way after a game like that.”  
said Arkansas coach Lou Holti. ‘ ‘ I 

, know that 1, as a football coach, was 
depressed but our football team was 
also.”

The next week, the Razorbacks

Don King 
steams 
in Nevada

LAS VEGAS, Nev. (AP) — Boxing 
promoter Don King was furious 
Thursday after the Nevada State 
Athletic Commission for the second 
time delayed his application for a co­
promoter's license.

King used some dramtic rhetoric 
and New York attorney David Rosen 
in his unsuccessful effort to get the 
license issued.

Dr. Jack Davis and Bob Shields 
voted to delay the matter, while 
Jackie Shields cast his vote for King. 
Commission member Dalby Shirley 
was absent.

SHIELDS, a Reno hotel owner, 
and Davis, both said they had 
“ doubts”  about King's application 
and wanted more information.

King had a license to promote in 
Nevada, but let it lapse after the 
1975 heavyweight championship bout 
in which Muhammad Ali defeated 
Ron Lyle. King promoted the match.

King was listed as the promoter of 
the “ Night with the Heavyweights”  
card at Caesars Palace here in 
September, but was not licensed at 
the time.

KING WAS listed as a consultant, 
not a promoter, for the Ken Norton- 
Jim Young bout at Caesars last 
month, but insiders said King was 
the man pulling the strings.

King now wants to be licensed as 
the co-promoter of a lightweight 
showdown scheduled at Caesars on 
Jan. 14 pitting Roberto Duran 
against Esteban DeJesus

During Thursday's hearing. King 
lashed out at Shields, charging 
racial bias.

Shields took offense at the 
remarks, and said his objections to 
King’s licensing are not based on 
bigotry.

Shields several times made 
references to the King-promoted 
U.S. Boxing Championships which 
were televised by ABC earlier this 
year.

SHIELDS ALSO charged that the 
Norton-Young fight was "poorly 
handled.”

Davis said he could not vote for 
King in clear conscience because of 
a controversy over the local televis­
ing of the NortoAtYoung fight, which 
was supposed to have been blacked 
out here.

King, as he did the night of the 
fight, denied that he gave the local 
ABC affiliate permission to televise 
the fight live, and charged that the 
station “ bootlegged”  the signal from 
Los Angeles.

were on the road against the Universi­
ty of Houston

“ I had no idea what the team's 
reaction would be going into the foot­
ball game,”  Hdtz said. “ But if I 
w[ould have had to bet. I would have 
bet we would have bounced back for 
one reason — the players just worked 
too hard all year not to bounce back.

“ The football players invested a lot 
of sweat, blood and tears in the foot­
ball team. Even though it was a heart­
breaking loss, when you have a lot in­

vested. you’re usually going to fight 
before you let it go down the drain ”

SO ARKANSAS beat Houston 34- 0 
and went on to win its last six games 
The 10-1 record brought the Rasor- 
backs their first-ever Orange Bowl 
bid

“ When we were 4-1 it wasn't a ques­
tion of saying. 'Well, boy, we've got a 
chance to be 10-1' All we wanted to be 
was 5-1 when we came out of Houston 
and nothing but 6-1 when we came out

of Rice
“ I've always been optimistic and 

always have a lot of confidence and 
faith in the players I can't say I'm 
surprised, but by the same token I'm 
not sure I would have bet on what type 
season we'd have "

In preseason speculation, the 
Razorbacks were picked to finish in 
the middle of the Southwest Con­
ference. Holtz, in his first year as 
Arkansas coach, had to replace tome 
holes in the offensive line, establish a

passing game and come up with some 
defensive ends.

“ I felt going into the season we 
could be com M itive if a lot of people 
came through I didn't realize we 
would lose certain athletes during the 
course of the season We felt we had a 
chance to have a competitive football 
team And that's all you can ask going 
into a season is to be competitive

“ YOU DONT rtaUy look at a 
aeason in terms of wins and losses

Ron Calcagni (18) has been the key to Arkansas’ surprising 10-1 footba ll season and post-season bowl date. (AP Laserphoto).

Mizzou coach denies charges
COLUMBIA. Mo. (AP) -  Warren 

Powers and his wife are the only ones 
who signed a 155,000 promissory note 
to buy Powers out of his head 
coaching contract at Washington 
State to take the head football post at 
Missouri, his attorney says.

Dave Knight, the Columbia lawyer 
who represented Powers in his

negotiations, said no one else 
guaranteed the note, the Columbia 
Tribune reported Friday in an ex­
clusive interview.

Knight said Powers, who was hired 
Tuesday as the replacement for the 
fired A1 Onofrio, gave him permission 
to clear up any lingering questions 
that someone from Missouri may

have guaranteed the note 
Washington State required Powers 

to pay 959,000 on the remaining two 
years of his contract to get out of the 
agreement. He made an initial

Etayment of 15.000 and the remainder 
s payable over three years at 9 

percent interest. His salary at 
Missouri is 135,000 a year

Laufda receives driving trophy 
despite 'scandalous' behavior

PARIS (AP) -  Austria's Niki 
Lauda received his trophy as the 1977 
world ctempion driver here Friday 
night, minutes after motor sport of­
ficials publicly had condemned his 
"inadmissible, Kandalous" behavior 
at the end of the racing season.

Pierre Uguex, president of the 
International Sporting Commission 
which controls racing world wide, had 
criticized Lauda ai^ former cham­
pion James Hunt of Britain at a news

conference preceding the award 
ceremony.

He was critical of Lauda for failing 
to drive the last two races in Canada 
and Japan after he had won the title, 
and Hunt for rushing to th? airport 
from the Japanese race and refusing 
to go on the rostrum to receive his 
winner's prize.

Uguex said penalities would be 
imposed in the future for such 
behavior.

Interviewed moments before he

went to collect his prize from Uguex 
and Prince Paul Metternich, 
president of the International 
Automobi le Federation. Lauda 
dismissed the criticism

“ I want to race when I have full 
support to do the best for myself, my 
team and motor racing The cir­
cumstances of the last races will 
never happen again.”  said Lauda, 
alluding to his bitter breakup with the 
Ferrari team.

“ The note was signed by two 
people,”  Knight said, noting that 
Powers was one of them. “ The other 
person was his wife ”

“ They asked me if I would

fluarantee the note," he said of of- 
Icials at Washington State Univer­

sity. “ I declined, saying that wasn't 
necessary, but I did sign as a wit­
ness.”

The Columbia Tribune said the 
question had been raised as to 
whether the University of Missouri 
gave Powers some assurance that it 
would help with the financial burden 
imposed on him Knight told the 
Tribune no one gave Powers any 
promise of financial assistance In 
paying off the note 

“ There was no guarantee on the 
note,”  he said, "and the note was 
drawn up in a way that he could pay 
it.”

“ There has been a lot of speculation 
that it will be paid off. and ) hope in 
some way It la.”  Knight said “ Not 
one dime has been guaranteed yet and 
there is not a payment due for another 
year I want to make it very clearly 
understood that he never asked me 
about raising funds ”

Going into the aeason. there wasn't 
aaything. if we could be 8-5, 7-4. or 8-3, 
there wasn't any of that. Let's Just be 
1-0. After we got to be 1-8, let's be 2-0.

“ We felt we would have quite a few 
cloae games. We didn't have as many 
as we thought ”

Why?
“ I felt we would be a pretty good 

defensive football team but I didn't 
know we would be as good defensively 
aswhat we were

“ We always seemed to find a way to 
break the game open, either on of­
fense or defense or the kicking game 
Some games we'd block a punt or run 
back a punt or hit the bomb to (Doo- 
ny> Bobo or (Ben) Cowins or 

RON CALACAGNI would break off 
a big run. We'd intercept a pau or 
recover a fumble.

"I  don't remember exactly but in 
quite a few of our games — maybe in 
eight of them — the average score at 
h^ftlme, I bet. was 21-0. Yet it wasn't 
one of those where you went out and 
Just dominated the other team or 
anything like that ”

Holtz said the Arkansas offense 
kept getting better and better 

“ We didn't put ourselves in real bad 
position very often with a punt return 
or with a turnover in our territorlty. I 
think in 11 games, only 13 times did 
we turn the ball over in our end of the 
feld, which is a pretty good statistic.”  

Ron Calcagni, a question mark 
when the season began, ended the 
year as the All-SWC quarterback 

“ It was like night and day. He and 
Houston Nutt, they made excellent 
progress on the football field in the 
mechanics, etc., but the greatest im­
provement was in the handling of the 
squad, checkoffs. Just being a coach 
on the field.

“ They’ve come a long way Now, 
they do as fine a job handling the 
balklub and being a coach on the field 
as any quarterbacks I've had,^ 

Calcagni had 624 yards totaToffenae 
In the first five games, but netted 
1,089 in the final six games During 
that period, he topped the 180-yard 
mark five times

That relieved some of the pressure 
on running back Ben Co wins who 
averaged 131.8 yards per game 
through five games and finished with 
1,192 yards — much of it against 
stacked defenses

ATBR BEATING Houston. Rice 
and Baylor by a combined score of 
99-18, Arkansas went on the road for a 
SWe showdown with Texas AAM.

Arkansas led 30-10, but A4M tied M 
20-20 in the third quarter before 
Calcagni and Robert Farrell booked 
upon a 58-yard pass play with 1:41 left 
in the game

Twelve days later, Arkansas over­
cam e a 14-3 halftime deficit to beat 
Texas Tech 17-14 on a 58-yard pass 
from Calcagni to Bobby Duckworth 
with six minutes left

“ The players have learned aome 
things We do feel we can come back 
We're better equipped mentally and 
physically to win a close game

“ Respect is the key word we've 
always used Self-respect, respect for 
your teammates and your Khool. 
what you represent, etc

“ There Is no way in this world that 
you can give aiw b^y respect. It’s got 
to be earned The only thing you can 
do as a coach is to put them In some 
situations where they can earn that 
respect “

Sonny (deserts Jersey 
for Garden Challenge

NEW YORK (AP) — burgeoning Meadowjands 
‘The telephone's Jangle Sports Com plex, an- 
d is tu rb e d  the mid- swered the phone and 
morning serehity in found a surprise waiting 
Sonny Werblln’t  home on the other end of the 
last Sunday. line.

The chairman of the The caller wasCharles 
New Jersey Sports and G. Bluhdom. chairman of 
Exposition Authority, the board of Gulf and 
m a s t e r m i n d  of  the Western Industries, the

conglomerate that owns, 
among other things, 
Madison Square Garden 
Corporation.

That is the .same 
Madison Square Garden 
that has b ^  seriously 
dented by the emergence 
across the Hudson Riv'er 
o f the Meadowlands 
complex.

The call was a matter 
of business. Bluhdom had 
an offer that Werblin

COLORADO RANCH NEAR 
PARI-MUTUEL RACE TRACK

398 gcre ronch between Durongo ond Poqoso 
Springs at Ignacio. Near Ute parimutuel Imrse 
rocing frock - ideol roce horse ronch 200 acres 
irrigoted, bolonce in hills with cedor ond 
pinons Good house, born ond livestock pens, 2 
woter wells Abundonce of gome deer, elk, 
beor, ducks $?50 ocre, totol S?98,000 29% 
down-, 7 interest S60.000 Federol lond 
Bonk loon ^I
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co u ldn ' t  re fuse .  He 
wanted the maestro of the 
Meadowlands to, Come 
back to New Yprk as 
president, chief executive 
officer and chairman of 
the executive committee 
of the Garden.

So, at age 87, Werblin 
succeeds Alan N. Cohen, 
a man 20 years his junior.
Cohen will return to his 
private law practice, and 
Werblin will try to 
breathe new life into the 
Garden which has been 
sagging under the weight 
of, among other things, 
the competition of the 
Meadowlands.

From the time the first 
blue prints were drawn 
up for 76,000-seat Giants 
Stadium and the adjacent 
Meadowlands harness tournament will be used 
and throughbred race for a memorial fund, 
track, Werblin has em- Byers said 
phasized the concept that
the Jersey sports com- Ball State University, 
plex and the Garden which had a game 
cou ld  co-exist  com- scheduled with Evan- 
fortably. He stUl feels the avllle, also agreed to play 
same way now that he’s a benefit game with a yet- 
moved to the other side of to-be chosen opponent.' 
the river. Byers said.

/

Evansville 
cancels 
cage slate

EVANSVILLE. Ind 
(AP) — The University of 
E v a n s v i l l e  formal ly  
canceled the rest of its 
1977-78 basketball season 
Friday because of the 
deaths of the 14 team 
m em bers and Coach 
Bobby Watson in a plane 
crash Tuesday.

A t h l e t i c  D i r e c t o r  
J a m e s  Byers  said,  
however, the Holiday 
Invitational Tournament 
will go on as scheduled 
Dec .  2930. He said 
S o u t h e r n  I l l i n o i s  
University volunteered to 
play in place of Evan­
sville for expense money 
only.

All proceeds from the

HOMEOWNERS INSURANCE
20%  DISCOUNT r'
3 YEAR POLICY

,, . Locks you in ogoinsf
on ihcteose for the 
full 3 yeas

I MTERS AGENCT 
.6S2-1112 6S24172 

102 N. "C " .

Coryell sorry 
for outburst

ST. LOUIS (AP) — St Louis Cardinals Coach Don 
Coryell, who earlier this week angrily said he wanted 
to leave St. Louis, has apologized for the outburst

“ 1 regret very much saying what I did in public, 
expressing myself as I did.”  the National Football 
League coach said Thursday night at the St Louis 
(Quarterback Club's awards dinner

Coryell's outburst came after the Cardinals' 26-20 
loss to the Washington Redskins Saturday, which 
dashed the Cards’ hopes of a playoff berth He 
criticized the Cardinal organization and the fans and 
said he wouldn't be surprised to be fired

Pistons interest Costello
MILWAUKEE (AP) — Larry Costello, former 

Milwaukee Rucks' coach, said Friday he is in­
terested in coaching the Detroit Pistons, but he has 
not been contacted by the National Basketball 
Association team

Costello now is chief Kout with the Houston 
Rockets His name, and those of A1 Bianchi, Gene 
Shue and K.C. Jones, have been mentioned for the 
job vacated when the Pistons fired Ccich Herb 
Brown Thursday.

“ I'm interest^ in getting back,”  Costello told a 
Milwaukee Journal reporter by telephone from 
Newark, N.J. He said he thought the Pistons knew he 
was available, and that he had been seen enough 
around the league so that the National Basketball 
Association team would know “ I'm on top of 
everything"

But, Costello said, “ I haven't been in touch with 
anyone. I haven't heard anything ”

Podolak placed on reserve list
KANSAS CITY (AP) -  The Kansas City Oiiefs 

placed veteran running back Ed Podolak on the 
injured reserve list Fyiday and added free agent 
-linebacker Otis Rodgers to the active roster.

Podolak, a Chiefs starter and the National Football 
League team's leading rusheT, suffered a shoulder 
separatk>n\ in Sunday's gam^ against the Seattle 
Seahawks.
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JIM  M U RtA Y !

After vicious attack,
Evel's world collapsed

JIM M UIRAY
•  Lm  Angetet T Ib m  tyadkau

la IMI. whfn he anaouneed he was 
goiag to jump the Graad Canyon. 
Evel Knievel was the toaal ot 
Am trka. Tlie grealeal authentic 
Weatcm hero aince Gen Cutter. 
Wyatt Earp on a motorcycle George 
Hamilton made a movie on hit life. 
Crovda followed him State (airt com ­
peted for hit tervicea So did The 
Tonight Show The Today Show The 
White House They brought out a line 
of Evel Knievel toys And they outsold 
Mickey Mouse’ s

In 1174. when he finally jumped a 
canyon — aort of — he became the

second-most identifiable American of 
his day He bought airplaoes by the 
squadron, cars by the fleet He had 
more boats than the Chilean navy. He 
Jumped his motorcycle over sharks, 
snakes, trucks He dressed himself in 
gold and diamonds He marched to a 
different drummer than the rest of the 
world. He was America's Accident 
He had to be put back together again 
more often than a museum dinosaur. 
He had more broken bones than a 
slau ^ ter house He was either in a 
spotlight or in traction He had more 
press agents than MGM in Its heyday 
He was Copy

Then, on Sept 21, 1977, This 
multimillionaire folk hero bought a S2

baseball bat at Sears Roebuck and 
broke the arm of a relatively puny, 
140-pound, cheerful little press agent 
nam ed  Shelly Saltman in a 
methodical, seemingly senseless, one­
sided beating in the parking lot of 20th 
Century Fox's commissary — and the 
music promptly stopped

Miami can't day-dream
against Buffalo today

MIAMI (AP) — Visions of playoffs 
may dance in their heads, but the 
Miami Dolphins say there's no danger 
of daydreaming through Saturday 
afternoon's game with the Buffalo 
BUIs

“ Ever since we put ourselves in the 
position that we couldn't lose 
anym ore," says Miami comerbaek 
Curtis Johnson, "every gam e's 
become a big game This one, we 
can't lose "

The Dolphins must win today to 
have any stake In the New England- 
Baltimore matchup on Sunday. Game 
time is 4 p m each day before a na­
tional television audience ^

If Miami and Baltimore both win. 
H'b another IIM tie, but this time the 
Colts would take the title because of a 
better record in the conference.

The Patriota are not completely 
eliminated A Miami loss to Buffalo 
followed by a Patriots victory over 
the Colts would aend New England bi- 
to the playoffs wHh a 10-4 record com­
pared to h-S for the other two clubs

But Miami's immediate problem la 
the Bills, who have dropped 15 in a 
row to the Dolphins and view the 
atreak like a long-overdue bill

“ It has gone through our minds that 
we could keep Miami out of the 
playoffa.”  says Buffalo quarterback 
Joe Ferguson “ Wd'd still owe them 
after lomng so many to them, but it 
would be a heck of a start toward pay- 
ln|themback "

The Bills' 14-10 victory over the 
New York Jets last week Improved 
Buffalo's record to 5- 10 One of the 
three victories was over New 
England.

THE ROYALTIES on the toys fell to 
the vanishing point. Nobody wanted a 
doll than went around beating up peo­
ple.

The guy on the phone wasn’t the 
President, it was the district attorney. 
The offers dried up. Evel had missH 
this jump, all right. This was not a 
part for George Hamilton This was a 
part for Conrad Veidt — a giiy in 
jackboots and a monocle

Suddenly, Uncle Sam was at the 
door with a bill for SI S million in back 
taxes. Bankruptcy loomed The 
tl0,000-a-month payroll was in jeopar­
dy. So were the t20.000-a-month 
payments. The diamond-headed cane 
went into mothballs.

Nobody wanted the image of a red. 
white and blue hero beating up a little 
publicist with a ball bat Evel had 
really broken his back this time He 
wouldn't clear these sharks.

What had happened* Well, Shelly 
Saltman had written a seemingly- 
harmless little diary-type book on his 
adventures as Evel's press agent on 
the Snake River Canyon jump It was 
hardly “ Roots" or “ Gone With The 
Wind." Bob Kirsch didn't review it. 
Neither did Time Nor the New 
Yorker. It never even came out in 
hard cover.

Jo«F«rgvioa
"They beat New England at New

England.”  Dolphihs Coach Don Shula 
id Isaid of the Bills "We know how tough 

It is to run against New England and 
we have to show a lot of respect"

In beating the Patriots 24-14 in 
November. W fa lo  was able to rush 
for 224 yards, including 155 by Roland 
Hooks, who was movH in when O J 
Simpson was lost for the season with
an i^ury. 

“ They

AMONG THE people who didn’t 
read it was the guy it was about. Evel 
Knievel says he didn't even know it 
was published till one day he went to a 
newsstand in Hollywood to buy a book 
on Elvis Presley Right next to that, 
he saw a book about a person he knew 
better, “ Evel Knievel On Tour." It 
was titled “ The Inside Stuff On The 
High-Living Daredevil Hero No PG- 
Rated Movie Could Ever Show'"

The man who had tried to jump the 
Snake River in a wingtip fuel can- 
nister, who had orbited sharks in a 
sputtering Yamaha, who proposed to 
jump 40,000 feet into a haystack 
without a chute, was driven into a 
rage by a paperback Once again, he 
hit the wrong lever He did the one 
thing you shouldn't do with a damag­
ing book ‘ Put it on naae one

LA R R Y  BIRD. 6-9 center for Indiana State
U niversity, takes a breather during game. Bird.

No. 3 in scoring nationally last year, is averaging 
32.8 points per game this season. (A P  Laserphoto).

Guy who pitched Yanks to flag
in stretch earned only $30,000
By BARRY W1LNER 
AP Sports Writer

ey're going to want to try and 
control the ball on us That's going to 
call for a lot of running on their part." 
said comerbaek Johnson “ They want 
to keep the ball away from our of­
fense We're looking for a ball control 
gam e."

I got a call from Evel the other day. 
Once again, he is trying to put the 
bones back together, to reconstruct 
the image. Once again. Evel Knievel 
has scattered pieces of himself all 
over t l / '^ r k in g  lot His image is at 

id W 6ground!

NEW YORK (AP) -  While the 
high-priced, well-publicixed New 
York Yankees fussed, feuded and 
made things miserable for each other 
last season, Ron Guidry was pitching 
his heart out

The 27-year-old left-hander who 
barely made the team after an 
horrendous spring training wound up 
the most effective starter on a 
championship ball club And he 
earned only S30.000 for his troubles 

“ I was just glad to make the team 
after I couldn't get anybody out in the 
spring.”  Guidry said. “ I didn't know

what plans they had for me. I was just 
happy to be with the team "

Yankees Manager Billy Martin 
didn't expect much from Guidry, 
either. But sore arms and assorted 
injuries to other pitchers forced 
Martin to turn to the Louisiana 
fireballer in May. Guidry won a start 
in Oakland, then another start He 
reeled off eight straight victories, 
eventually compiling a 16-7 record. 
176 strikeouts and a 2.82 eamed-run

hefty raise — between two and three 
times as much he earned in 1977.

“ The Yankees made an offer to 
extend the contract and I thought 
their offer was fair," Guidry said. “ I 
want to pitch for New York because 
we have a good team and there's no 
reason we can't come close to winning 
the World Series again"

average.
Now Guidry can feel comfortable in 

New York as one of the aces of the 
Yankees staff He also can live 
comfortably after agreeing to a three- 
year extension of his contract at a

If the YankMS do win the cham­
pionship again. Guidry will play a 
large part. Martin knows just what he 
wants from him this time around.

" I  hate to think where we would 
have.been without him last season.”  
Martin said. “ He's as gutty as a guy 
can be."

TEE TIME O

Visitor scores Hogan ace
< *  - w . .  ■ .

BY REX WORRELL 
Hogan Part (M f pro

We’d like to take this opportunity to 
thank all area golfers for their kindness 
and patronage this year The golf and 
maintenance staffs at Hogan Park Golf 
Course would like to wish everyone a 
Merry Christmas and a Happy New 
Year.

The teenagers entertained a guest last
week Virgil T. Pylant joined the group 
while in Midland visiting his brother 
Thurman Pylant I'm sure Virgil's visit 
will be a memorable one as he scored a 
hole-in-one Wednesday on the 180-yard 
par three No. I hole

Calif., scored the ace with a four-iron 
shot witnessed by Thurman and Chet 
Powers Aided by the hole-in-one. Virgil 
went on to score a fine round of 37-38—75 
Congratulations. Virgil

69 while Jane Wagner was second with a 
net 73

Golfers will be seeing some new trash 
barrels in the coming weeks at Hogan 
Park Golf Course The barrels are 
compliments of R L Faulkner and Petro 
ChemCo ...

Jeanne Allen and Bernice Webb tied 
for first in the nine-hole flight with 37s 
while Mary Davis and Evelyn Guidry 
posted 41s...

THE HOGAN Park Women's Golf 
Association had their annual end o ' the 
year party and will not have any 
scheduled playdays until next year

VIRGIL. A resident of Long Reach.

The ladies had a spur of the moment 
low net event on Thursday with Marilyn 
Philpy winning the 18-hole flight with a

The Hogan Park Men's Golf 
Association holds its final tournament 
today, a scotch twosome The tee times- 
10:15 WIlUams-Thorpe. Howle-Sitton 
10:30 Munttel-Goodin, Moore-Beaty 
10:37 Mattina-Pepper, Bellis-Bemal. 
10:45 Flourmoy-Kurc, Dishman-Miller 
10:52  T a y l o r - T a y l o r ,  K i r k e s -  
Schwinkendorf 11 Shulta-Crawford. 
Hartsell-Miller. 11:07 Pyle-Brown, 
Carter-Cooper, 11:15 Hurt-Perkins, 
Freeman-Harris
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PUBLICATION DAY DEADLINE

Saturday, Dec. M  
Monday, Dec. 26 
Tuesday, Doc. 27

I I  a.M. Wednesday, Doc. 31 
4 p.m. Wodnosday, Dk . 21 
11 a.m. Iliursday, Doc. 22

Classified Display Advertising

PUBLICATION DAY DEADLINE

Y Peanut cage Geruiaius raAC punishes
defeats

loops organize pj,,/Denf So. Colorado

Thursday, Doc. 23 
Friday, Dm . 23 
Saturday, Dm . 14 
Monday, Dm . 26

13 Noon Tooidny, Dm . 20 
12 Noon Wtdnosdny, Dm . 21 
4 p.m. Wodnotday, Dm . 21 
10 a.m. Thorsdoy, Dm . 22

Each branch of the Midland YMCA is accepting 
registrations for Peanut (fourth to sixth grade) 
basketball.

Teams will be formed on a neighborhood, 
elementary school boundaries basis 

Games will be play Saturday beginning Jan 21 
with fifth and sixth graders having the option of 
playing on last year's team

SYDNEY,  Australia 
(AP) — Vitas Genilaitis 
moved into the semifinals 
of the 9210.000 New South 
W a le s  Open tennis  
championship Friday, 
beating Australia'a Phil 
Dent 6-4,34.6-4.

Word Ad Deadlines
DENVER (AP) — The University of Southern 

Colorado football team has been placed on one-year 
probation by the Rocky Mountain Athletic Con­
ference Presidents Council, Commissioner Paul W. 
Brechler announced Friday

PUBLICATION DAY DEADLINE

At least one parent of each participant must at­
tend meetings Jan. 3 and 5 at the Y branches

Coaches and officials training teutons will be held
Lee High 4:15 p m Jan. 9 and 6 30 p.m Jan. 1 at the 
CentralY.

A City-Wide basketball clinic for coaches and 
players will be held at Lee 7:45p m Jan 9

TIBURON CASING INC.
DALE SMITH,

2, M)diond,P.O. Box 4272, M)dtond, Texos 
^ 0  Permian Building

Wi I l f  Wflb, L is ts , PnlKtioi I  t p i p i i t  
CMp(ilillittii|Swici
9 * S - m 7 a r M 9 - 7 M 2

In other quarter-finals. 
Australian Cliff Letcher 
beat American Butch 
Walts 6-3, 2-4, 4-1; 
American Brian Teacher 
defeated countryman Bill 
Scanlon 1-1, 8-4, and 
Roacoe Tanner scored a 
strong 74. 8-2 krin over 
Auatralian Colin Dibley

Brechler said the probation period started last 
Sunday.

Fridoy, Dm . 23 
Soturday, Dm . 34 
Monday, Dm . 26

.Thursday, Dm . 22
3 p.m. Friday, Dm . 23
4 p.m. Friday, Dm . 23

He said the decision to place the Southern Colorado 
football team on probation was made by the 
presidents council following an investigation of 
alleged use of ineligible players "in certain football 
contests and a grant-in-aid violation "

Classified Cancellation Deodlines

Letcher,  the only 
Auatralian still in the 
tourpey, will play Tanner 
SatiTrday while top-seed 
Genilaitis will play the 
unaeoded Teacher.

The presidents council ruled that the Pueblo 
school'i football team would not be permitted to 
compete for the 1978 RMAC championship and would 
not be permitted to participate in a post-season game 
or activity during the 1978 football season

Tharsday, Dm . 22 
Friday, Dm . 23 
Satardoy, Dm . 24 
Moadoy, Dm . 26

4 p.m. Wadntsdoy, Dm . 21 
4 p.m. Wodatsdoy, Dm . 21 
3 p.m. Friday, Dm . 23 
3 p.m. Friday, Dm . 23

NO PUBLICATION DECEMBER 25

TH INKS
M U D

O O N D U niA M
M 14S 5S

"Because the incidents detailed in Commissioner 
Brechler's report are both conscious viol^^tons of 
Rocky Mountain Athletic (Nipnfereoce regulatons 
and breaches of acceptable ethical conduct, and 
because they Reflect negatively on the inntegrity of 
the RMAC and thus cannot be ignored." the coqncil 
ta/ld. "the football program of the University of 
Southern Colorado shall be placed on probatton for a 
period dI one year, commencing immediately Wishes You H Joyful Holiday Season

I I

Southern! Colorado earlier, was forced to forfeit 
three RMAC garnet for using ineligible players.
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Crime of piracy\now flouris 
in overcrowded Nigeria seaport
The Guardian

LAGOS, Nigeria — Last Saturday morning at Bar 
Beach, on the rich residential Victoria Island in 
Lagos, a number of men. mostly young, are executed 
by military firing squads

Sobbing parents and relatives can often be seen 
among the small groups of people for whom this 
routine event might still be a novelty The makeshift 
site of the executions changes from week to week, 
but it is never far from the $36,000-a-year rented 
houses of company directors and diplomats and the 
ultramodern Eko Hotel, where unknowing interna­
tional businessmen gather to stake their claim in 
Nigeria's future.

The Monomic boom caused by oil exports and in- 
dustralization, and the increasing gap in income bet- 
weM  a minority of affluent Nigerians and the over­
whelming majority of the population has certainly 
had a direct bearing in the rise in violent crime. 
Those executed are sentenced by special courts for 
crimes that are reminiscent of those that prevailed 
in Europe and America in previous centuries — 
pirate raids on ships and armed attacks on travelers 
on interstate roads.

But where the occksienal ambush on lorries and 
air-conditioned cars involves mostly Nigerians, the 
pirate raids on ships berthed or moored in Lagos and 
Port Harcourt, the outlet for most of Nigeria's oil. 
have wider international repercussions.

With an average of three armed robberies and 
frustrated attempts a week on the thousands of inter­
national ships that call at Nigerian ports every year, 
protests and demands for action by the Nigerian 
authorities have been made from time to time. Over 
the past few weeks, at ieast two British, two Liberian 
and four Greek ships were attacked while in 
Nigerian harbors or waters

About two weeks ago, the situatibn took a dramatic 
turn. The Danish Cargo ship, Lindinger Ivory, carry-

HOMEOWNERS INSURANCE
20%  DISCOUNT 
3 YEAR POLICY
Locks you in against 
on increase for the 
full 3 years
MYERS AGENCY 

682-1112 682-4172 
102 M. "C " .

ing 2,000 tons of soap chemicals, was attacked while 
moored offshore within sight of Lagos' overcrowded 
docks The first descriptions of the attack were given 
by the chief officer, who was seriously wounded in 
the action. The captain. S K Frederiksen, was last 
seen bleeding from bullet wounds, being dragged 
overboard by African raiders, perhaps to be thrown 
into the shark-infested waters. His body has not been 
found

As for the circumstances of the attack, it can be 
assumed that they involved a high degree of prepara­
tion and expertise A number of Africans, emerging 
from what sounded like three fast-speed boats or 
motorized canoes, climbed up the ship, footin g  their 
way into the communications room b m re  ransack­
ing the cabins

The crew's inadequate resistance was rapidly 
overcome by the raiders, armed with a machine-gun, 
several guns, knives and machetes The value of the 
goods and equipment stolen was not known, but their 
degree of sophistication leads to the conclusion that 
the gangs operate within a well-organized network.

The news of the attack and the brutal cir­
cumstances of Frederiksen's death brought the 
foreign shipping and business community together 
With a widespread suspicion that compiacency so far 
might have been caused by a desire on the part of 
company agents and diplomats to keep good business 
relations with the Nigerian authorities, the incident 
soon became a major international trade union issue 
Scandinavian, German. British. Greek, American 
and Russian ships' captains organized themselves 
into committees to appeal to their respective em­
bassies for strong action against the Nigerian 
government Within a few days, and while rumors of 
other frustrated attacks, including one on an Israeli 
ship, were circulating, there was news of a joint pro­
test from the EEC-countries.

Mounting international action in turn brought 
other unexpected repercussions in Lagos Several 
Nigerian newspapers, taking a defensive nationalist 
line, began to blame the attacks on gangs from 
neighboring countries In a series of raids on fishing 
villages in and around Lagos, police claimed to have 
found some of the goods stolen from the Danish ship

Fifty people were arrested in Ibesche. a fishing 
village 10 miles north of Lagos, whose 900 inhabitants 
were described by the Lagos press as being mostly
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• W A S H I N G T O N  -  
More than five years 
after Congress instructed 
it to make safety inspec­
tions of all private dams 
in the United States. Ar­
my Corps of Engineers 
early this week began im­
plementing the program 
by examining an ear- 
them dam holding back 
11 billion gallons of water 
one mile above a small 
New Jersey town

"Superficially, the dam 
looks ok," said Frank 
Vinci, head of the corps' 
team that inspected 
state-owned Spruce Run 
Dam upstream from (Tin- 
ton, N.J., population 
1,100 But he asked that 
the level of the 40.000- 
acre-foot reservoir be 
lowered so that the outlet 
works tunnel could be in­
spected later

The visit by Vinci and 
f o u r  o t h e r  c o r p s  
engineers to the mile-long 
dam marked the start of 
a multi-year effort to in­
spect 9,000 privately 
owned dams bi "high 
hazard"  locations — 
meaning that their cot- 
lapse would result in loss 
of life and heavy property 
damage

In 1972, after dam 
failures in West Virginia 
and South Dakota calim- 
ed about 300 lives. Con-
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clandestine immigrants from neighboring countries 
'The attack on the Lindinger Ivory was regarded as 
"an act of terrorism against Nigeria." and the 
village of Ibeshe as a "launching pad by illegal im­
migrants for nocturnal attacka in Nigerian waters "  

After interviewing several ships' captains and ex­
perienced people in the port services, one can only 
conclude that piracy is a well-established crime, 
brought about by the peculiar coodHioas in Lagoa 
and Port Harcourt

The docks have been chronically congested At the 
time of the attack, despite the fact that ships have to 
give two months notice before arrival, there were IM 
ships berthed at the older Apapa docks, and the new 
West German-built port of Tin Can. or moored off­
shore waiting their turn for berthing Congestioo, 
pilferage and piracy have been issues worrying sue- 
cessiye Nigerian governments, they were given 
priority by the present military regime when it seiz­
ed power in 197S.

However, most people were unanimous in slating 
that port security arrangements were hopelessly in­
adequate When It was suggested that perhaps 
pirates keep a permanent watch on any slackness in 
routine police patrols, most captains laughed 

They remarked that the only probable deterrent 
was the knowledge that ships, with the help of local 
company agents and at great expense of time and 
money, have made their own security arrangements 
Some suggested that police patrols might be working 
with professional gangsters and that one could never 
be sure whether a contracted watchman was a ge­
nuine guard or a gang spy

Dam inspection 
program starts
By GAYLORDSHAW 

«  Lot Angeles Times

G if t - ld e o s

f g id a ir e
Our Lowest 
Price Ever On Th is

NCM-a

gress passed a law
atating that the corps "at 
soon as practicable 
■hall carry out a national 
program of inapectioo of 
dams for the purpoae of 
protecting human iife and 
property "

But the law was never 
implemented becauie the 
e x e c u t i v e  b r a n c h ,  
through the M’hKr House 
Office of Management 
and Budget. decIM  not 
to seek fundi for M. con­
tending that dam safety 
was a state responsibili­
ty

Last summer. Con­
gress on Hs own initiative 
voted SIS million to start 
the program And last 
month, after the collapse 
of a never-inspected 
private dam near *roccoa. 
Ga.. killed 39 persons. 
President Csrter reless- 
ed the funds snd told the 
Corps of Engineers to 
start making inspections

Spruce Run Dsm in 
New Jersey was selected 
as the first to be in- 
s p e c t e d  b e c a u s e  
residents of the town 
below ' expressed a 
desire to have U check­
ed," said Dirk Hoffman, 
deputy director of the 
New Jersey Division of 
Water Resources, owner 
snd operator of the IV 
year-old. 90-foot high 
structure

Hoffman accompanied 
the corps inspectors on 
the vlsH to the dam site in 
a state park 29 miles from 
the Pennsylvania border 
Under the program 
ordered by Carter, the 
corps is to train state per­
sonnel for future safely 
inapectioos of privately 
owned dams

National surveya show 
that fewer than half the 
states now have adequate 
dam inspection pro­
grams. and dams hr these 
states will receive priori­
ty in the corps' effort

Califomia's atate dam 
safety program is rated 
by experts as the best in 
the country, and Carter 
administration officials 
are using the California 
law as a model they are 
encouraging other states 
to adopt

Offer
snubbed
The Loo Aagclca Times

LOS ANGELES -  
Carter Hawley Hale 
Stores Inc., Los Angeles, 
earlier this week offered 
to buy Chicago-based 
MarahaU Field and Co 
for t lt 2 million — and 
promptly got a stinging 
rebuff that included an 
antitrust lawauit to Mock 
the bid

Carter Hawley Hale, 
the parent company of 
the Broadway  and 
Neiman-Marcna. along 
with other retail chains, 
proposed a price of 931 
per share of the Chicago 
department store chain; 
"a 9 a basis (or negotia-/ 
U O O B "

If the two firms were UK 
merge. Carter Hawley' 
Hale would move up from 
its present spot as 
oevOiHh largest depart­
ment store chain to third, 
b e h i n d  f e d e r a t e t )  
Department Stores Ine. 
and The May Department 
Stores Co.
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Air slowdown
/

threat averted
niocf
Depend on likely

WASHINGTON (AP) -  C hrM nat bolidAr 
traveler* will aot have to perry atoot a riep dewa in 
ahiiae Uaffte after an agreemeel betwee* the 
govem m eat and the air tra f^  rmitraOen 

The agree«ient *■ a nep tfirve-year reotract 
averted a threatened *lopdepn hy the eeatroiler* 
pho dopct air traffp In and ont of the nation'* air- 
porta.

Ratiflratioo of the agreement paeecpertedtouke 
about five peek*, anioa official* *aid 

Joha F Leydgfi. preeident of the PrafeMional Air 
Traffir Controiler* Organuatioa. aaid the anion 
reached a aetUement Thuraday after marathon 
bargaiatag aeaaion pith the F e ^ a l  Aviation Ad­
min itratkln

If the contract had not been aetUed. Leyden aaid 
be P'aa prepared to call for a )ob action "on the peek 
prior to Chrlatma* "  ^

rather than unlikely
By ALFRED SHELNWOLD

Mathematic* will not tell you hop a 
auM ia going io break or whether a 
fineaae will work It will tell you what 
ia likely to happen and how likely it i* 
In the long run you will profit by 
depending on what ia likely rather 
than on wnat la unlikely

\.)Tih -«-.ih vulner^tiir
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Fatl

Opening lead — A 2
Kaat win* the firat trick with the 

king of apadea and return* the nine to 
South'a)ack

South haa two anre trick* in each

auit and plana to try for hi* ninth trick 
in diamond* There are two way* to 
play the diamond*, and South muat 
chooae

One play i* to caah the ace of 
diamond* and then get to dummy with 
a spade to try the diamond finesse 
This works if Edst has the queen of 
diamonds

The other play is to lead out the ace, 
king and Jack of diamonds This will 
set up dummy's nine if the suit breaks 
3-3 or if the ten of diamonds drops ear­
ly South's jack of diamonds will be 
good if the queen drop* early 

DOUBLE CHANCE 
Few players would know the exact 

odds, but experienced players should 
Judge that a double chance is better 
than a single chance 

The finesse ia only an even money 
•hot; the odds are b^ter than 2 to 1 in 
favor of playing for a drop 

South should lead both top 
diamonds When the ten drops. South 
leads the jack of diamonds to set up 
dum m y's nine

DAILY QUESTION 
Partner opens with 2-NT <32 to 24 

points), and the next player passes 
You hold- SKM. HQIOT; D107; 
CJIOM. What do you •ay'*

ANSWER Bid three clubs, the 
Stayman Convention Asking partner 
to bid a major luH of four or more 
cards If he bids three hearts, you will 
raise to four hearts, if he bids 
anything elae. you will bid 3-NT

m Q
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Rhodesian raids
into Mozambique
take heavy toll
TtM Washington Poal

CHIMOlO, Mosambique — Rhodesian incursions 
deep into this newly independent "frontline" nation 
are creating havoc for tens of thousands of civilian 
refugees from the Rhodesia war living in camps 
along Moxambique's western border 

Moxambican authorities have just asked the 
United Nations to step up assistance to cope with an 
additional S.000 to 10,000 refugees who have reported­
ly fled from rearbase and transit camps belonging to 
the Zimbabwe People's Army, the main nationalist 
guerrilla force, following the latest Rhodesian Incur­
sion The guerrilla force takes Ks name from the 
African word for Rhodesia 

The plight of the Zambabwean refugees is one of 
the least publicized aspects of the Rhodesian war 
This ia partly because they live in remote camps that 
are dMkult Io reach even in the dry season 

It is also partly due to the Mozambique govern­
ment's effort to keep outsiders, even international 
agencies like the U N High Commission for 
Refugees, from vtohlng the camp* No foreign relief 
officials, nut even doctors, are stationed in the 
camps, according to Western diplomatic sources 
Only in the past couple of weeks has Mozambique 
allowed reporters to visit the camps 

While the Rhodesians insist they are only hitting 
camps of the Zimbabwe People's Army, each raid 
seems to leave death and destruction among the 
civilian refugees as well

It is not clear whether this is deliberate Rhodesian 
policy or an "accident of war "  Some international 
refugee official* say part of the problem lies in the 
failure of Rhodesia's natkmalists to deafly separate 
the civilian population from the guerrilla camps 

There are already about SS.OOO refugees settled in 
three U N.-assisted and Mozambican-run camps 
The largest is at Dorol, about 20 miles northeast of 
here, housing nearly 11,000 It is a short distance 
from the main guerrilla camp the Rhodesians oc­
cupied and largely destroyed on Nov 23-24 

Local authorities told three Western cor­
respondents who were Kheduled to visit Doroi 
recently that it was no use going now The refugees 
were all hiding in the bush during the day for fear of 
more Rhodesian attacks, they said 

"Many have been traumatized by the attacks." ex­
plained one local official "They don't want to talk 
even to ns without their own leaders being present 
They think we may be spies for Smtth" — Rhodesian 
Prime Minister Ian SmHh 

The refugees still return to Doroi camp at night, he 
said, but they have given up planting their fields just 
as the rainy season is getting under way The result 
is expedted to be a food shortage, as exists in the 
other official refugee camps 

The white-minority Rhodesian government has 
termed the November incursion — Rhodesia's big­
gest — a spectacular success, with as many as 3,000 
casualties inflicted on the main nationalist guerrilla 
force

The Mozambicans say the main victims were non- 
combatant women and children living in transit or 
reception camps

The death toll iS still mounting a* more wounded 
refugees die in the hospital here and in the port city 
of Beira and in Tete City, 220 miles to the north The 
latest official estimates are that about lOO refugees 
were killed in the Nov 23-24 attack on the Mecombezi 
guerrilla camp outside this Portuguese-built colonial 
town and nearly 2S0 at another camp at Tembue in 
Tete Province The number of wounded is put at 700,
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More Great Gifts
in store for you!

•'.V’.Jffi

14 9 9
Our Fteg 10 M
Toastmaster Sizzler* Burger Cooker/Qrlll. Cooks 2 
burgers. 6 hot dogs, eggs or pancakes In minutes Npn- 
stick costing iSNTM  List-ref $29 75. TOASTMASTER.

\T

4 ^  Rsscassx
Our Fteg 6 47
Durstele Breed Trey. 9*6%' with 
relief design S8141-LR Ltst-ref 
$0 95

9 7

9eg 2 
>r OerIndoor Oerden Set 3-tools end 

tomi/er in rettan basket S7933X 
QY List-ref $4 50

Hpmington

Our Reg 18 77 
M  Remington Ladles' 

 ̂ ^  Deluxe Cord Razor 
Qentle Touch" cutter 

andultra-thin heed AC operation 
aWER5000-RX List-ref $23 95

16"®

fJoreko

140

QE FM/AM Digital Clock Radio 
24-hour alarm set Wake to music 
and/or alarm. Snooz-Alerm* Slide 
rule dial S74321-EQL List-ref 
$49 95 ^

y 'm p rx o n .
Emerson Cassette Recorder 
5 pushbunon controls with 
automatic stop Microphone 
Battery powered SCR44EEM 
List-rel $39 95

0

9 4

Our Reg 31.94

Norelco Electric Rotary' 
Razor".
36 self-sharpening blades 
Nine closeness/comforl 
settings Deluxe travel 
wallet. SHP1121.
List-ref. 39.95

127
Our Reg 3 59 
Kodak 160 Color I 
Movie Film. Super- !
8, 50 roll ;
S1625920-EK I
List-ref $5 15 N.

.SenAww

i97

Our Reg 4 57 
Mattel Surrey Cycle" 3-wheel. 2- 
aeater with basket For Sunshine 
Family* figures Ages 4-12 While 
quantities last S7237MT List-ref 
$5 45

,/pNN
Buys SavutlSI 
SunbMm HubawOtlur 
Buy mruu unxt. 
Sunbuam rubaWs S5 
ap«ca SIS total' 
Buy two gat $4 aach 
Buy ona gat S3 back' 
Sunbaam Factory 
Babata ottar good M 
Oaoambar 34. tS77

Our Rag 32 77 
Sunbeam Centurion Fire $ Smoke 
Detector. Detects fire before 
smoke is visible. Horn alarm 
Operates on 9-volt battery 
•45-21-XU List-ref $46 25

W hat have you  been paying for your 
health and beauty a id s ?

Save on your favorite Brand Name items at Ardan!

irwm CutBX Oily Noil Polish Remover-
Lorge4-oz bottle Our Reg 47

Sava on the complete line o l Johnson i  Johnson Boby Shampoo-

Our Reg SI 97

.29

$1.47

Cadbffry Oiocolote Bors-assorted flavors Fomily 5-oz size 
Our Reg 69   49

Smwckers Swoot Pickle$-vat-cured whole sweets 
fuHOoort Our Reg SI 29 ,3 9

Gilletfe Troc II Blade$-5 double edged blades 
Our Reg 97 79

WHILE LARGE QUANTITIES LAST

JfWCLERS A OaTMBUTOSS

CHRISTMAS HOURS:
Kh«»|s > l4 S i id a > ' lh i* t *  F r i d a y  1 0 - 1 0  

'A sa lsk rday  1 0 - 9 ,  K s s n d a y  1 - 6

N
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SavvtIS! in R*6«M0n«r | 
'M  unit*.
■m rtbatM (S 

tIS totaf 
Q gM $4 MCh 
>• gat (3  back' 
•m Factory 
I ottar good tH 
ibar 24 1 977

l e g  3 2  7 7  
re A Smoke 
b e f o r e  
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l e r y  
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area prtoa a not 
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-NOTICES 
NOTICE 

APPUCATION 
NUMBER:8526 

N otice  is hereby 
given that Felipe M. 
Morales, Jr. is making 
appl i cat i on to the 
T e x a s  A l c o h o l i c  
Beverage Commission 
for a Wine and Beer 
Retailers Permit to be 
located at 2407-A N. 
Big Spring, Midland, 
Texas, under the trade 
name of Casita Gerar­
do and that a hearing 
will be held on 20th day 
of December, 1977.

ROSENELLE 
CHERRY, County 

Clerk
MIDLAND COUNTY, 

TEXAS 
By Jeanette Moore 

Deputy
(Decem ber 16,17,1977)

PATIO
Check your attic, base 
meni. garage and closets 
for good, but no longer 
used I te m s  .— furniture, 
tools. tfte list gdes on 
and on Every item sftould 
be priced, of course You 
may want to combine your 
sale with a friend or neigh 
bor Choose your days get 
your signs ready and place 
your ad in the Classified 
section Your ad should 
list a lew key items give 
the date time and good 
directions
A  friendly Classified Ad 
Visor w ill help you word 
your Garage Sale ad lor 
mammum results

d ia l
682-6222

For Pal*o S a l* A d  Vica

682-6222-

O FFICE HOURS:
Wwfc O ay i. .  I  fg $ g.m

Closed Saturdays
Corrtetions and cancalla- 
tions may be made Satur­
day morning between • 
am and 10 am only.

AFTER AD HAS BEEN 
PLACED, IT MUST RUN 
ONE DAY.

PleaM check your ad the first 
a«V If appears The Reporter 
Tefegrem Is respensIMe only ter 
the firs t day tar arror that 
n u llliits  tha va lu t o( tha ad

COPY CHANGES
Ip  m davarlarleaiiailcallaneicaetl 
a m Friday tar Sunday admans. W 
a m Saturday tar Manday adifiana

AIR COND SERVICE

WHO'S WHO FOR SERVICE

Air conditiondrs drained and 
couared Furnaces cleaned end 
serviced All sites lo turnace 
filters, twmacc controls and 
parts A ir conditioner cavers and 
now furnaces

JER R Y’S 
SHEET m e t a l  

7 B 0 N  F t  W o r t h  a ( 4  4 4 »S

BOOKKEEPING aTAXES

WORD AD DEADLINES:
iiSSa m Fridey ter Sunday 
S'Mp.m Friday tar Manday 
4 Mp m Manday tar tuaaday 
4 to a m Tuaaday tar ytadnaiday 
4 SI a m Widnasday tar Thursday 
4 :M a m Thursday tar FrMay 
4:Mpm FrMay tar Saturday

I SPACE AD DEADLINES;
js.Mp.m. Friday tar Sunday 
S asp.m FrMay tar Manday 
I M p.m Manday Mr Tuaaaay 
3:tt p.m Tuaadaytar yytdnasday 
l:M p m Wadnasday Mr Thursday 
3 Mp.m Thursday Mr Friday 

to  tOa m FrMay Mr Saturday

DISPLAY DEADLINES:
It sea.m. Thursday Mr Sunday 
tl:Na.m  Friday Mr Manaay 
4 Stp.m Friday Mr Tuaaday 

tl SSam Manaay Mr tutdnataay 
13 Ma m Tuasdiy Mr Thursday 
l3:Ma.m Wadnasday Mr Friday 
3 00 p m Wadnasday Mr Saluraay

SAME DEADLINES APPLY 
FOR CANCELLATIONS

Classified
Advertising

Lodge Nofkw
Ktyttont Crt8pWr No IT? 
and CowfKM N« M?
Ammbiy Nftt 
MCh moom Ot9rt« work 
Ot< IS. 7 JO p m PoMt 
M *ytr» M P V#f«
A d 8 m t T I M  
Gm  MpdNy SdC RfC . Ail Yprk Ritt
AAMom ____________
Acpci* LOdft No U\4 
A F 4A M )000 Uplaod 
St«t«d Comtn Dtc Ulh 
7 «  PM Vtork m EA 
ddOTM CiirittmM f6mMy 
night Spf Ok  17m. 
pm Schooi ot idHtructi^
•vpfy AAo«M«v night. ‘
PM All M«MfH invltvd 
Chpfi«t Crouch gr M Ai TAihot____________________
Mtdipnd LOdgp No 673 
A F i  A M 18M
WPlI. M? m7 stptpd
mMting pnd Proticipnty 
Expminpteon ThurMay 
Dtc 7?nd 7 » P  M 
J A M bitt W M Gtorgt AAtdity 
Stcrttpfy

HOMEOWNERS INSURANCE
20%  DISCOUNT 
3 YEAR PO IICY
Locks you In noinst 
on increase for the 
full 3 years
MYERS AGENCY 

682-1112 682-4172 
102 N. "C " .

•OOKicEEPiNG th my hpmt IS 
tmptfitnct tvM chprgt tiA*nopl 
SiSttmtnn Pitiiiyg ptyrdlf mcomt 
f« i ttfvoctt •t*trtnce%. rttspntboe
gt3 0 H 5 _____________
•OOKKCEPING Strvect ptyrolfV 
Q uprttriy r tp tr tt  t in tn citl 

fm tw n  6t3 4A7? y  68a I3)t

CARPENTRY A CABINET

CONCRETE WORK

M E R R Y
C H R I S T M A S !

Orivtt curbt. toundpttoni tK
U yMfttKptfitnct CtlittttTBPM

694-4889
FR E E  ESTIAAATES

BURR!
Let Jim tlx your lireplecc and 
taka out tha smoka Avoid tha 
mud Driveways, walks, patios, 
and slabs
Free Estimates Jim Lofin 
____  694 5192______

CONf^ETC conttructipn tnd rtptir$ 
CurM^drivti tioort ttundttitnt. 
wtfki. ttc Strvtng Miditnd M ytprt 
Fully inturtd ttr ytur prottction 
Htibtft A Htibtft Contrpctort M3 
3731

DIRTWORK
MANUEL JUPAOO Dirt ctntrtctor 
Fill din trtth hpgiing pnd ytrdt 
grpdtd M? 7731___________ __  __

D IR T W O R K  
VALDEZ TRUCKING

MASONRY SAND. PEFILL DIRT 
Lot cManinp. coav manurt landKap 
Inp

CALL
6 8 2  1 8 7 9 , 6 8 3  1 0 0 6 ,

6 9 4  5 5 0 7

WHITE'SGRADING 
8. EXCAVATING

A s p h a l t  P a v i n g  
P a r k i n g  L o t s  &  

D r i v e w a y t  
C a l i c h e  

684 8983 
AAidland

ELECTRIC SERVICE

FURNITURE REFINISHING
FUPNITUPE rtttmghfng. frttpKk up 
pnddt4tvtry gusrpntttd werii Phpnt 
M? »3t? _  . _

MAULING
light hpuling trpth trttt Me Will

HOME REPAIRS, i  PEHODCLINO
THE Howm Ddcltr Cptnprpi Ptpp*r%. 
•tmgdtitnd. Ppmting Aht CuMom 
huHl C6binttt Fftt ttttmpttt 
•ondtd Phpnt6«7 $SM«rM3 77M

HpiRE REPAIRS, i  REN006UNG
W Bv.ld>f-i ^rama and

ramaoaims alw panaimp Fraa 
astimaMS madt CaN aM 3W a«Mr S
MnO dPUM

e .G O S S
BUILDING & REPAIR 

A d d  o n s  -  r e p a i r s  H o n r t e  
o r  C o m m e r c i a l  S p e c i a l i i i n g  
I n  f i r e p l a c e s  T h e r e  i s  n o  l O b  
t o o  s m a l l  F r e t  E s t i m a t e s

694-8662 

N E E D A  
J O B  D O N E ?

Cpti Jghn tppopittmg m cprppnrry 
pplnttng rwmodHing * n d  cph*n»trv 
Fdr your horn# or pH»ct imidtorout
Com

683-7302

PAINTING i  PAPER HANGtNC

Rptiddnfidl «nd Cdmnstrctdi rwmpdtf 
mg rtgdtr pnd rppm MMitiont 
drivdw«v$ pdtiod «>ddw«ih» hom« 
m«»nttndnc« hregtdcM »nd mpsenry 
1 3 y 6 « r i  t A p d fi d n c *

R ay & Jay  
Construction  

682-1831 or 682 1334
PEMOOELING tnlprtpr 6nd«it«r(0r 
Rtdwood dp<ks our Ipdci6<ty LOC«l 
rdtprencdt M7 6646 M7 y2»

T o p  Q u a lity  
Insulation storm windows 
Y .o u r  
E .n e rg y  
S .p e c ia lis ts

Free Estimates
684 9032

CALL thy Custom C«rptnl»fB lor now 
conitruction romodtlmg ropoir 
pdtnting cobmotry ond ipoAioity shop
ildmi M? 7173__________
PEMOOELINGipoctdltsn AddttignB 
dpthropms potlot gorogos cenv«rtod 
to rooms Aisocommorcioi fMOrk Wor 
ron Booubton M4 74M

PAINTiiM ConoirvetkP doseWiKB' . 
grid fom»»er<oi SYoorsfaporento t 
Fulty tnoufld McGnMor Poantuig 
C g m g d n i  C o * I M ) H 8 i  _  |

RESIDENTIALAND | 
COMMERCIAL 

20 years ot experience I 
H A IL  P A IN T IN G  '

c o a a p a n ;
Wilbur Hail 68f60l

EASl V rotsTdd cdn^onv ^  
vddrs oaporionct OftKos 
dfOM rtgoirs. fhootrock hnishint 
6»4 »4f3 Nolson
PAINTING tnlor«or ond oatpridr 
SNOdtrocS ropotr « Bpociotty igroy 
toatono ond ocoustii Froo •stimolts

PAINTING controctor fully tnsurod 
ondbondod Tbyoofsoapononso Com
more tgi Add rot4donf>di 443 74ds 6tytr
L  ■ . . . .  ■
PAPCRHANGING pomftng «0M 
ropoirs ProloMtpnol Cloon ond 
dopondobH Nosmoswao nodrinsing 
6>7 6116 dr sai^ _
INTERIOR ond oaltridr po>m*nd 
mmor rtpotrs Froo osttmotys Com 
Frod JOhn^ ^4 3t4t doy or dt^t 
PAINTING mtoridr ond oaNridr 
roskdontiol ond commorctoi Full «or 
vkt olferoftons ond ropo«rs Fr«o 
tstimotos 6Ff }*}9dr697 itu

Out of the brisk, 
yetir family Moy yotf 
tha Igvg and fosonotion of fht stoson

aw comes 0 smnn ond heortfeh witft thet the hoiMfoys bring merrimenf fe you end 
be filled ttiih simple, eld-foshioned joys of the holiday May you eeperience all

ROOFING
MtE Rooltnd CompdHitton grovdf 
Pdteh poNd corporfs Fro*osttmofm 
CdH iKfPW ^
E 0 Culp Rodftng Co AM typos of 
roofs ond rtpoirs Fro* trsttmoNs 
6»4l43Sor6l7 464S

INSULATION
LAWRENCE Corr insuiottdn Coll 
dN07l4Or »97 4 707__________ ______

LAWN iGARDEW SERVICE
co m p le te  londscoptno Fl#«**r 
bods cl*dning tr*« topping ihrubbory 
trimming oU*y dooning ftornyord 
IgrtlUftf tor SON 6i?4>87 
MOW tdg* ond 'trim Fioam bods 
dognod trt* purning oiNys doonod 
Trgo romovod Cdopor M4 40*1 
6d4««07
TREE sorvk* ony typ* Shrub prun 
Ing shoormg *apori*ncod town t*r 
yie* sproying 617 4738

MASONRY WORK

SHOE REPAIR
DECKER StdOfRopoir Hours 17fd4
PM^H68M?M

SEWING i  ALTERATIONS
SEWING ond oit*rotions Coil
t f U * 2 5  -

STEAM CLEAN ING
INDUSTRIAL  

STEAMCLEANING 
O i l f ie ld  e q u ip m e n t, 
trucks, pipe Portable 
unit 24 hour service 

683 4821

TRAdORWORK
MESQUITE grvbbkAg dong' work 
SmoM plots or oertogt lipg* sOot**r 
^ v K *  W  7M Odtsso 
WANT Igrw toworii Bd4 ll/i 
BREAK ING. diKtng *04 117)

BRICK block Sion* concr*t* n*aa 
work ropgirs. r*mod*ling fir*p4oc*s 
sfgps porchos No lOb too smgll fro* 
•stimotos oapofioncgd ol4 9683
t t l i l l L . . ___________________

MISCELLANEOUS SERVICE
YARD f«nc* buHOtng ond r*potr«ng 
Trot trimmiog Con si? 47«o

NEED
MUD LOGGER?

10 y rs . E xperience  
Dependable Equipment 
C a ll 915-59JJ237

asphalt pointing d*r*ct«nol or 
rows pgrking spgcos lottormg 
Hooding tong *Bc 1 Fro* *st»mo9*s 
AlbortRivgro 687 7774

UPHOLSTERY
u p h o l s t e r in g
cushions of oil typos 

Or Of
Choirs ond 
YOU brn<8 IN* S94 U37

u p h o l s t e r y  ond droportos 
Roosongbl* Fro* ostimotos Work 
fuofontood 6<4 1873 ^

WATER WELL SERVICE
w ater  «yglK for MidtQnd sme* 1fS3 
LOftiS Comply 687 8|43 
KLUG Wot^ Wofi Oritimg Fro* 
•otimotos Phono 6*4 SM8 doys ond 
wookonds

R ead And Use 
R eporter  
T e leg ra m  
W an t Ads

TOMM.ItTOteMLtt 
■ tU A c n c rn t i iY iu  

■Atm u t t -

W A N T A D S

DIAL 682-6222

* M

BOYS! GIRLS!
DOLLARS FOR YOU!
Excellent earnings for your time 

in monoging your own newspaper 

home delivery route for

Ebr ̂ iMotilî rporfrŷ lrgnmi

UOAFwnl S Loeti Found

To get complete details on this 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY

and learn how others of your oge are 
profiting while they learn sound business 
methods, fill out and mail the application 
below:

APPLICATION

Circulation Department 

The Midlond Reporter-Telegrom 

P.O. Box 1650 

Midland, Texos 79702

Yes, I'm interested in knowing more about the op­
portunities in handling a home-delivery route.

1
I Nome__
I
j Address
I Phone No.. .Age.

MQ0.00 REWARD
/ /

UAMNG TO TNI RfCOVIRT Of

FRECKLES/ /

laret orongt one ajiita mola bittanv Sgonial I  yawt kW 

LOST Ik VIONITT Ot WtSTVilW STATn

a U  563-0378 DAHIME
AFTIR S PM IINEEKENDS S63-0K6

Lodge Notiew
M iaian a  Cam
m g n d tr y  *84 
T h g r t d g y  
Ng»*mg*r W 6 PM 
gpwwf konrod by 
Sgooi Ord*r of 
Bgggcoggf for 
C#

ond fhgtr 
Igdigt Sfgood Cgn 
c ia v g  All Sir 7 ^  ^
Kh*fhf» ^
«gkgmo Jomot L Romoey Com 
mgodgr Bgfl K Ttmmom Ji*«org^ 
Sgrayberry Lodge 
I136S AF B AM 
ttgted  m ttfifig  
t v o f y  t h i r d  
Tiftgdoy 7 3IPM8t 
MidkiH Bob Bloch 
W M M L BigvtfH 
Soey

Hnoh*h
FOR http with on yfbwod pregh*Acy 
coll Edho Gfodfiey Horn* Ft Worth 
T*»gt 1 100 7f? 1164 
SPEClALtZlNC M children t ho«r 
Bhgptng Glided Cog* Boouty Soion 
^M747 _______

"MARY KAY COSMETICS
Sybil WOHOC* 6*4 5464_____

NEEDpf0y*f9 Thor* or* peogn mil
togfgproy COII687H49 _ _  ___
OR INK ING problem m your Irf*> CoH 
Midlond Cgghcll #n Akohoittm
6*7 4731 ?4hboro*rvK*______  _
N A S A  Singlet oettviN** Hof L»n* 
74 hour gnowertf^ •Frelce 563 31 <7 
FOUR igfa Meditofion Gorggnt Coll 
^ 371*___________________

S H A K L E E
P R O D U C T S

Give the g*tt gf Heetth * Nytritign 
give Shpkiee Food S*pd*em*nti igr 
ChfiatmM Lod*e« * m*n'f cgiggn* 
^tt ten tvgitgbit 6*4 3571 gr 8*4 6117 
f017Oentgn
Not open for business 

on Sunday
N E E D  

A  B A N D ?  
Rock & Roll 
or Country  

C A L L  682-2056 
" R H Y M E $  FOR  

R E A S O N S ” ,
Ftraana) FMtrv tor tvarv t f tm tr  A 
btaulMv) way la My "I iav« yau' ar 
’ CanfrMuMtMni Wrrtnax lor Ilia 
tp to lk  ptrw i W naru Wu »ama 
WMaMa lay lyamma Sana ■nav'r'n la 
iw ; Searka Miaiana. Tnaa « a i  Mr 
prka ana MmoMt _  ̂ ^
FOUR Carian eawi Nexata »  yara 
lina ufear aacx baal ttMr Mttiat
Call altar taluraay _________ ,___
WHAT Koiiwaklt ftrvica tan i aar 
farm Mr yau balara H Oactmatr Mr 
tM T Caraact W katan Ml Hm M  
ealWrin aftbr i  amataaya

LOTT raa waiwi terwamwe 10 ana 
amar Mpara tia rywara Ca"
>4’  tmi
kOaT Waal Miaanana am.iy tarrwr t 
yaara aM Arnwara M iaau nai waar 
•nf collar tatl irom Snanaan A 
yyniinay aar atja

iso R ew ard . 
" P r e t ty  Boy”

a t io r T  b a i r a d  t t r r i a r  M « c X  w i m  
t a n  m a r k i n g a  o n  f a t a  c b t t t  a n d  
l a g a  i  i n c k  b o b t a i l  I  t o o t  t i o f e n i  
h a a  t l o a  c e l l a r  w<n> t a g i  i r o m  A n  
t e n  T o x a a  e a f o r o  s a e j a T I l  
a x t  1 0 2 . 004 a i | 7  a a k  l o r  A A a lin d a
aouNO Marx anowniiatoanaaoaoa 
Ona maM ana lamata iw>m laiMr 
VKHi.ly tadlara a tiraal Ml lata tr 
t a t  m t

$200
R E W A R D

A A a la  m i n a t u r c  p e e d M  M a t X  
a i l v o r  a n d  w t i i l a  A n t w a r a  to  
P a p p y  n o  c e l l a r  a i t r a m a l y  
a b a e e y  m i a a i n e  1  w a a x t  
^ 4  4457

LO ST M A L E  
Australian Shepherd
Whft* finth Betver grey end blech 
mgrhingtgn bgch ond foce blech te«i 
«nth gthif* tip Lett Thvreooy nagnf 
Dec 8 betnuen 11 ond t o m from ovt 
kfde of th* E mber% Ldvnge Cell Ang*i 
et oe; 17>* or 5*3 157* Pioow h*«p hn 
retyrn Qffi Nheertbroken 
LOST, preocfi^ion gle**e* m TG4Y.
Decern^ t^Rewerd 8*4 47*3
Please com t* yg* h#v* «oen gr hngw 
«p4ereobovn of mimtor* mg«* bfech 
poodle Anowert fp Pnne* Let* m 
vtcmity of Flpf* Court RedcoMorhod 
ofdtog Cett 8*7 4817

LOST
FEMALE AFGHAN HOUND

11 monttn ofd omwer* fe Heather 
Bigeh with beige mgrkmgt tveer*ng 
blue rhmettgn* ceUer Mts««ng irtm 
yieintty ef Hegen Porh Gbif Cevro* 
ond N Big Sprmg 687 87** Werh 
6*4 7g*8

REWARD
REWARD LP*i «moM red met* pg* 
die red end green ribbem on ht* »ers 
Am*m« fe Renter C*H Gienn 
6*4 87*4 etttf 6 6*7 M57 _
LOST tie dotp with * hmeii d4emon#i 
end 7tmefi A * in middle Lo*6#tO*P 
ny't or Denny t perhinf igf t|H 
rewerd Cell 6*4 8171 
lost bfech lemgt* Doberinpn
Pirmher wtthtencjH^^e4i887 8igl 
STRAYEO tfwm 39M SMcfe«r Wbff* 
nbgig Peke e pgp f^weert te CherlH 
Brown nb t|i  ̂ / Ceft 8*4 8*37 tr 
6*3 4771

— A —
MAY tgeckei r#v end kippin**B ofMch 
come* anth Chr«ttme« ebide mth yev 
end ygvr* A 1 Figrei Me WH W
W^let O 6*3 4787
BEST *.Bh*« Mr e ~M4dpy 
Sogton Irgm Acm* Aw*e Pern en* 
gmgieyee* lit  An*r**r» Htghwey *87 
m i68?S 34S _ _
AFT AM PRINTING 713 WesMndxene 
**4 *0*1 tm«he« ygv eng ygvr iem«it e 
yfty pret^orgut y*4K 
BEST wtiihe* tg ygg en* v«vr lemaiy 
trgm Allege Treve* BMg #f Sewfh 
wett *87 «*66
BEST yyi6h*t Mr * r«egdv ff*« ^e*c 
frgm th* * mg toy*** of AmgM % 
Ggrege 4*0 South Peco* **4 eeii

— B —
WE «n*h rov Peec* en* My B&B 
Trgdtng Pg*t *17 foBi m«ngH 6*7 
7*J6
BARBARAS Wi* BevfMM* Th* 
moot weih*d ebovt he«r m tmtm 
Prgftteeonei itvitng en* contwitefign 
With** ygw Hegpv HgiMeyt B* f
t h ^ l  6*3 7U7
SEASONS gro*tingt M ell evr 
cutMmert trgm Wilhgm 5*oi*« *n* 
E* OrifwoM *f B*ro Mp6or Cempeny 
6*4 7741 Mtdiend tFafwrttu^Cert
MAY ip*i »#( lov on* heppin*M which 
com** with Chfittmet *b*d* w«th *gg 
•nd yggrt B*rry t Nk* * Oeen 
Cent*r NO I 8*7 5 Midkifi 6*4*137 
Ng 7 43D*W HiWMIt 4*4 *18*
MERRY Chrittmet en* Hoppy N*w 
Ypor frgm Th* Book Worm D»ii«fgg* 
Melt 6*4 0171

MERRY Chfiftmet en* Hoppy n*« 
Yoor Borden uv 7405 W Miitewri 
684 0774
BEAUTIFUL iMwer orrengementt 
for Chrittmet end w* new cerry or Mel 
govmt Hepgy Noixdeyt from Rote 
Rev end Sue McOoneM ef the Brtoei 
•eutiQwe 1411 North B*t 5pr>ng e03 
6773
BEST WISHES Mr th* HolMev 
Sootont from Buddy % Fiow*rt 1505 
W*tt Welt 683 6773.
BURN S WoldMf Workt 8*4 Cotlmt 
683 0e*5 with** you th* M*rr«*tt 
Chrittmet end Hopp«*tt N*W y*er'

- C —
WISHING you mabaat Hal may Saaatn 
avar Jaa H ana Pal Catat Catat Car 
carnar ati Ian

- c -
WISHING Ma ka«> M yau and rdurt 
CliyWMaeiacinc Ovanar jatFuaiaM 
ataaati
WISHING Ma an> M yau ana vdurt 
Curl and tdari Taum and CdaMry 
sncff  n^CanMr a ^ i in

— b —
DON t Pauitry and tM  Camaany 
CarMrMM* daaa akl aaaa mynat yau 
ty<a bati M,t taaaon

— N —

MotWY Loew, Wenttd
TOP Sdoiiera Mr diemondt tM goM 
ettef* precet tirKtiy centiO»wttei 
Cell 6*3 3177

F IN A N C IN G
A V A IL A B L E

Long term term remh en* <omm*r 
cMiMont AltprefmencMf

Lubbock M o r t ^  Co . Inc 
Metro Tower 1720 Broedwey 

Suite nos 
Lubbock. Texet 

7 6 7  0 S 7 1  _
CHKItTIWAt leant M IIM C I C 
Fmence 6*4 **f4

Scltooli Imtrvctien

E N R O L L I N G
N D W

L e a rn
ABCSHaRTHANO atw tekt 
BUSINESS MACHINES aUlaNki 

(IBM Ktypunckdickieiei 
STENOGRAPHIC it, tMwwxi 
BOOkkEEPlNGd, aNtwaxi 
se c r e ta r y  M aTlPdtXt

F rw  pmenant aiMtdfk* 
HlinaAc i4l MUttanct it kNOM 

F«d*r«l erttitt and iNm trt
•vtilebit te eiMi ititd tee*K 

Cll at 4141 w er* Nr ctmpWKtt**
C D M A A E R C IA L

C O L L E G E
"C ertified  by Texes 
Education Agency" 

I 3 M  A n d r e w s  H i e b w e y  
e«7 4i4«

D R A F T I N G
Prtpare tor Ml ratattd petilioaH 
Ervotllng Ninv

C O M M E R C IA L
C O L L E G E

3304 Andrews Hwy 
Phone B97 a im

POUND OatMt Maun* L>Wit Ori 
arWyytiita Vic inky al Miyiana Or < 
Grtanbriar 4*4 ^7) ,

•aadAnaUM
■avarMr
TaMeraM

IS ■ a-*—ngip wgnig%i
NFED Mfrgimen Mr ne|pt teewtty 
d * f^  '*d pey R*v«f hgv* regwir** 
tchggiino rggwtrp* by th* $t*«* «f 
te ie t  Cett8*7n77orU3P?7 
n e e d e d  btilmg cigrh en* twUemer 
8»**«c* pertpn 48 hOBirt »•** 
Ggntfpi Med.cei 3Ml W Weft 
8*4 7f04 _
EQUIPMENT cgereMr Oh <(*«* ter 
vice cempeny noe*t comgrrtoor 
ooerefgrt Rogwtr* rewohnect or drtti 
ing e«dert*nco TrentpgrtetMn 
necetogry Tre*of ttme retmbgrto* en 
MCOtign EerntngtMtIliWpor y*gr 
Advene ement pottibi* Cofi MMion* 
563 7804 Mr eppointm»m

C H R O M A L L O Y -
D E L T A M U D

Hat openmgt tor taitt tn t  tar 
v k a  anpinetrt taiery tommtn 
turaft Witt, axparitnea a»caiient 
com pany benatitt taldpNorw 
Uirry ^ratitr 71J t»7 4tM 
SklCx layinf corHrarlart Mt 4471 
M7tt77 lu  m t Mt M4 
LINEN ftupaty rautaman arcaiianr 
pay arcallani yyerx inf canaitmn aa* 
ly m partan tnaonna Luian Supply 

SpuM 4av«nta«d Wipiana ta«a»

J O U R N E Y M A N
P A IN T E R

Ntetfed to work in MMIprM ta tS 
per tMwr Apply to fprtman at 
Midland Colltea t  tirw arts 
building
D E A N  H AG LER  INC.

aaual eapertunity^meieyar

E X P E R IE N C E D  
GASOLINE MECHANIC

Must have own tools
Apply In par ton

Permian Trucks Engine 
1305 Garden City Hwy.

eOOKKtCeeit tiva ar mara yvart 
aiparmcKa CaN atttrtl Mr appauM
mam ______
MAINtfNaNCE and landarial man 
naadad 4thour yyarx yydax PiaataraH 

_____ ________
colonial tMt itairtt ampidymanr 
avaiiatda. lull lima ca Iwurt appty 
Mparttn 71WW tram ana 4MN tM 
tpruM (Ndaphaiiratidn ana iNt m 
•uracKa arW Ma apaartunity ta tuh
p a tjn ti^  ____ _
WANTeD lady Mr Manhauw t dan a 
yatax XAutt turnith Nampanafian ana 
ratayancat Cantaci Laiila Punyt
4k7 4>;7 attar t _____
MAX)* ailtMM wrvka camaany 
naadt IvN tim* tnap tramaa 
Man auarapa ttarti

xaCPPV CKritimaa arW Happy Naur 
Yaar |y«m Pan Gan and taraaa at
MardatMi Of*H *>

tC ASON S Graatmt* M an aur 
wtndtrtui tutMmart Nam imparwi 
Gull SMiNarMiybdkrH at) cTH

— J —
WISHING the beef M ygw en* yggrg 
Jerry t ShOdf Metgi m  Ngrth Fgri 
Worth 6*4 44*5

•L—
SEASOifS Gru tingt M tor mgny 
frlgfvdt trgm Le* Street A«H Cenfor 
Ml S tee 884 *484
THE Merrtdti ef Chrtttmetet en* 
Hggpedtt gf New v*grt M *» eur 
friery^frgm ten* Ster Prep#rtt*t 
LUIGI S itgiign Rettewrem m  Ngrth 
tM$P'*ng 683 4363 «nth*t yeo eM th* 
b*6t thit y*gr

—
MID CONTINENT ims fgrmerly 
bcgfttth Inn with** en* en* *M e 
l^gfoothgitdev teeten 6*7 778J_ 
SEASONS Gr**l*ngt M *H egr wgn 
derfyl <v6Mm*ft frgm Mgd*rg H4*r 
Fethwnt MOW«%Mii*ne«t 6*3 6MI

-N —
NiTA en* tteft ef Nile t Ce«* ertthet 
thetr meny fri*r>d« en* cytMnwrt A 
Merry Chrttfnet

— O —
GLAD HefMey Ti*mgt fe ewr meny 
friendt end ce6Mm*rt 0 CMnneM 
OftKel lM Ngrth N 687 #137 
SEASONS greeting f r ^  Frgn en* 
CfHKk The OHKe MeM iM M4 An 
drewtHwy 6*3 697 
MERRY ChTHtmgt end Hippy New 
Yegr We cere Mr ygy On* Hew 

Hmitnp 6*4 I87t 6E7 85*1

— P —
BCST W i t h e t  th re g g h  the  HpUdev 
l i u g n  f r o m  P m e  O f f K *  S g w p m e n f

.*J1  ̂ ^  L
M S T  wvthe% M r  e M g p p t f M N t g y  
Seege n T h * P g f f e r y P M c g  7 M 7 N  B«g 

6773
W I S H I N G  yg g  M d  v d o r t  e  p rg id e rg g t 
N e w  Y e g r  P y r g M fg r  S g t*r > *Y  tn r M8 
S C g M rg g g  5p| 18 4 ' ,

— R —
T m I  k a m a d a  H u i v o A a *  M r a «  A
M a r r y  C v i t i n a t  a n a  M aa p y N aw

te A t O N t  G ra a r> n p i N a m  ah  a t u t  at 
P o P a r t t  A u M  t u p p iy  A  X X a th m a  tn a p  
m s (  k M r m a
f o A x b a P O W . t a a a y  unH Pa y a tM r  

d a y  P a m a m p y y  yd u r y a tt a r d a v t  m m  
p N e r e e r e p h l W a anil M  tM a a d  
D a t a m P a r  t4  M r u  Ja n u a r y  I  Saaaan % 
G r a a lm p a  P u p m *  t t u a w  aar r s H  M l 
W  O tu a

— s —
M E R R Y  C h r t t i m e t  M  #ll P p m  Sgiw 
t g g c »  m e m b e r *  e n g  T h e S te ff 
M e y  y g w  H g lid e y t  be m e rr y  W « 
g n ib y  t e r y m g  yg g  Sh eke y t  P u i e  
P e r i w  S H I  A n W e w t  H a |h w 4 ) _
S t  A S O N  S G ^ m g t  M  e fi e w  
c w t t g m e r t  R e n g y  e n *  G i n g e r  
S k y w e v  t g w M *  M M i e n *  A n  t * r  
min«^583 7 5l*
M E R R Y  C h r t t t m e t  H e p g y  N e w  
Y g g r  W *  ente y t t r e m p y g o  SngoR^tf* 
C M g n e r t *  L e w M t y  687 8 tl7  
B L A O  H o h d e v  tM t n p i M  e w  m eny 
f r m n d t  e n *  tv tM m # r %  S e o th e m  
R e d i e f w  M 5 S  T e rre ll t * 7  4 3I*

W I S H I N G  y g y  t h *  b e ti * f  t h *  H g « i*e v  
I t e t g n  It  t e w  p r h r i M g e M tg r y e  ygg 
S e w th w e tt A g f g m e f i y *  R e p e ir  *
S g E E^  f  6 *3 4 716
M E R R Y  C h r tt tm e t  H i p p  n e ti m  f h *  
N e w  V e e r  W *  en te y te re m g  ygw Strip  
B e e w f|  S e M n  664 4441

H A P P Y  H g f i e e y t M #11 t h * f r w n * « e n *  
c w t t g m e r t  tr g m  S w e d e  | i e < t r a i  
C e m g e n y  e n *  w n g M y t e t  6 *7  8185

— T —
X A A y  M a  e ia ya m p a at M a  C M i t i m a t  
ta a x a n  p a  y a u r t  T a h  C ity  t v  ( a P M  
a f t  t m
t e  A t O N S  O ra a tin p a ' T h a n a t M r yaur 
p a tr a n a p t  na<y an a M r a u d A a id  M a  
y a a r t a h  C ity  W i i a m a  Supp ly 
kMyrda

— r —
tXAV cnriaimat Prmp ydur Ppartt 
dutrru Wa anyay tarvmt you TaaxpMi 
Span-ynMn taliw Wall ___ __
XAAV auary piaiamp at Ma Cxritimaa 
tpaaan pa yaurt Bht Tarratf Sap4t(
Tana^man^ ______ ____ _
MCPNV Ckrittmaa. Happr Ma«i 
vaar' taiaa Parm Ouraau OaP 
MMXm Larry CrarHara Oa«td
Pwiw____ _ ____
atOLibAy Graatmd* and minat Mr a 
araaparaua Nam vaar lam • PianaW
4  Candy DHHipuMr Ml Nat ____
WISHING yau a Marry CXrittmat Wa 
appeallaM yaur aaMmapa taum A 
Caunlry Ciaaninp and Laundry a44
HJ7 .............._
MAY Ma yparmi my and »taaMwi 
yyhk* camat *<m CXfiatmat aPMa 
ynth yau and yaurt tha traatuaa

— V —
CMPlStXAAS Paht rma aut aaat 
ynthat M aur Hwndt ana <utHmart 
VeMncia t upheMMry 4«) * , l  
MAY MaPaautyalChr.timatPaydurt 
npyy and aNcayt VdMnc la t  janriarmi 
SarvKa cat2*4)
XAAV Ma Jay Chrittmat Prmpi apMi 
*<M yau ana yaurt WalMy a urmtura 
AUfiwittray tataiO _

— w —
XACapy Chr.t'mat and I Had) Maw 
Vaar Nam an al ut Wati Ta>a» 
Papraduclian Campany Mt N 
Caiaraaa aaauti
holiday Graatmpt ana tmeara 
Manki Mr yaur (ancinuad at'anapa 
Wattan t AuMmahya M  IM  
WISHING all a vary iwarry ChritMiat 
ana a Happy Naw vaar rutar Tnat 
Ottua Supply _
XAAV Ma Happmaaa at Ma )MI «iyt 
paruad* Mru out ydur ••raa WaaMrd 
SUIIm SMaxhauta lit  Andrtwt mma 
• • t  _
XAAV yaur haliaayt Pa marry and your 
tulura Mydut Tammy Wh,M Simply 
atlalai
t e s t  unanat Mraudh Mt heMaiey 
taatan wm t By Prm<iM Ml MarM
Bif Sfrmp aai Mat _
w e uHtn yau rmry haaamtta Mr 
ChriUmat and Ma Ntw Vaar Wm 
rhah t OarM* Hauta aat aail
WISHING Ma paw Mr yau ana yaura 
Nut Chrmimaa Saaaan WaiMNurtary 
iMNarMiandCanMr aax Mar

IS MeIgWmtet)
HOUSE k fiP E R  8 I 8 A M M 5 9  
P M  5 geyt week t  chsM rgn Ceh
6 *4  86*7^
A p p l i c e t l o n s  n o w  b e i n g  
t a k e n  f o r  h e l p  I n  c o n c e s s i o n t  
e n d  u s h e r s  M u s t  b e  1 4  y e a r s  
o r  o v e r  A p p l y  i n  p e r s o n  a t

HODGE THEATER 
__ O F F IC E S  

IM M E D IA T E  
O P E N IN G

Cat plant c lerk sat rptary te pro 
cess invoKPS ipka prodtKiion 
rpportt mainlpm tlMt opnarpl 
lypme Goad typist 4 e**^ *n 
malt! Salary open Can AAt 
Cbandipr at a t i  411) or attar i  
eng weexengs, p e )  |7>7

N E E D E D  
MANAGER TRAINEE
M hour work weak SBIO manlt, 
AAust ba willine *e rttocata Cx
cettdfHtrtnod benefits Call

683-5502
C A B IN E T
M A K E R S

P a h  tHTW saa d  p a y  l i p t r w n r t  
n a a P a d  C a r h a ri

JAKE KEMPER 
M 3  5 1 0 4  

o r  c o m e  b y  
I S O O W  I n d u s t r i a l

S E R V I C E  
S T A T I D N  

F O R  L E A S E
Apply Godwin Stetion

1809 N .
Big Spring

W A N T E D  g e d *h g e g « * g rg w d m e ffw  
f y d *  f e d *  *8  c e re  fg r fw g  chtidp«*i  ̂
m y  h g ffw  O w h  N g y itg w e fie v i S4| g*p 
w e e k  6*4 6674 e*4 fm  
T R U C K  d p fe e rt needed 7 7 y f 8  W e g *
3 y e e *%  e v g g f*e w c e  G g g d  g e y  
b g h * t * i  v e t e f t e m  g rg e g  m e w re m * 
M w t f  h e e e  geed d rn rm g  re tg r g  C e«' 
I I I  I 7 l t 0 d e * 6 i

P U R D L A T D R
S E C U R I T Y

Nowbirw«e security euoriH App 
ly at tee S Cstersds betwaan l  
AM 4 S NM ar call Ml »47 ppt 
wean I  AM 4 $ PM ter sppiint 
ment

^ N 'S
N E E D E D

Onerecevary room BN 7 Itnitt 
One eenaral duty Bn lle lltM it 
Contact E Leyd BN 
Director et Nurses
PARKVIEW HOSPITAL 

683 5491j^ext 24
N E E D  

D A Y  T IM E  
B U SB O Y  

Apply in person 
Shera ton  Inn M id land  

401 W . M issauri

LVN'S
W g H fe d  f * y  e m g fg ym e iyt e f tgeef n w t  
m g  h g m e  I  RM f t  t l  RM ih ttt  end l l  
R M  fg  7 A M  Ih tft  G e e d  t e lg r y  g g t *  
e g e e fid h  fre w d  m tw e h c e  eegnebi#  
R te g g *< g M

683-5403
IM M E D IA T E

O P E N IN G
For tales clerks ExparlerKP 
hetptui but net ntcdttary Appty 
in person

NATIONAL BUILDING CENTER 
3111 W F ro n t St •

E  g u a i O ffp s rtu rM ty t  m p M fy r

NURSES 
AIDES ,

Needed to r Westgate 
AAanor Nursing Center 
Beautilu l new home App 
ly  at 2B00 N AAidland 
D rive

15

frehtggrtetwh 
pofht^heHt 
fhrvFrldRY

! -J *1

' f
• \

tegygg* tfertM telgry m 
m dPdeerehA m«tt hev* gge 
ggrtettgn C9< 6*41874 fgr eb 
mefft bf*we^ 8 efRt^ Meedgy

\

%i H o u r

ttirapdms, tt Nsvr wrax Paid
tidlidayt. paid vaeptMm

R A L P H  LO W E  
C O M P A N Y  

362 0393, Odessa

JA N IT D R IA L
COMPANY

N E E D S
S uperv iso r fu ll or 
p a r t  tim e
P a rk in g  lo t a ttendant 
M a ids , porte rs , w ith  
ow n  tran spo rta tio n  
A p p ly  in persan  

Room 102 
210 N. Big Spring

A f t e r  4 P M

R E T IR E D
Need e x tra  money? 
F u ll t im e  P a rt tim e  
Be a BURNS GUARD 

C A LL  
563 0123

E X P E R IE N C E D  
D E L IV E R Y  M AN 

N E E D E D
AAxnI baud cammerc le) ikpnaa 
Apply In person 
H E A T H  F U R N IT U R E  

108N. AiUin
W A N T E D  

P IP E  STORAGE 
R E C O R D C L E R K

tptdryapdh Prttar wpurnrua
McClatchy Brothers. Inc 

4400 W In d u s tr ia l 
M id la n d , Texas

Mf CHAHK ■ewied kttft* he«* dew 
hgh* tggft GsegreM** eng hgf r#H f 
dgy wgrt w**k Cenfgct Bib tkeHer 
%6bgn Brgfhgrt ktkC t*31781 e«*en 
tibnn

18 y e a rs o r o lder 
F u l l t im e  P a r t  t im e  

bea
B U R N S G U A R D

c a ll
563 0823 

BUS H E LP  
W A N TE D

AM# to tuorx neon lirrM st»tt B 
Sdma fvpytine* Aeely m Bdrtdn
enty bdtswdn S e  11 AM sr ptttf a 
BMtoXAr Nachman

LUIGUS
1I1N Big Spring 

WANT TO EARN GOOD WOKE r 
WITHOUT OiSfUFTiNGYOUfi 

family LIFE’
Bdcom t an Avon BpprdSdnttfivt 
and snioy thd bdst ot both worlds 
Th* m an tj‘% good and th* hourt 
llpxiblp Y# tUM Put how Can 
AAarearpt Luct. AVON DittrkI 
M^agw MieSTO
CASHIIB iMcxar naadud Apply m 

tan IM phana cant Pwryaa* 
fy*n  Brattan XXhX tMr* tN An 
draws H,|nw#][

A C T IV IT Y  
D IR E C T O R

tor local nurtme horn* Salary 
commdnturpid with aiparitnc* 
paid vocaliont group msuronc* 
profran , mut* b* sufetine pnd 
hauB geed ptrtenaBty Bor mor* 
ir ^ m p tie n  pitas* tail ta) sa03

SUB
C EN TE R

COUNTER HELP NEEDED
Up to S3 80 to start

401 Andrew s H w y.
XXANPOWCB naadt yau Nr Mm 
parary and (ammums laupnmamt 
Ja’ OjB _

drTvers 'wanted
Apply

YELLOWCHECKER 
CAB CO.,

BIOS. Big Spring 
STAR T I M ^ D I  ATE LY

CdURIER
Need driver, full and part 
lltne

An aeudi ̂ Jpparhymty ampâ xrar
C ali 682-76X  
or 683 7811

S E C R E T A R Y /
B O O K K E E P E R

N**d d*p*ndaM# lull Urn* 
Sdcretpry tor locat artKt OutiM 
will McTudd tvpine liime busk

Salary ddpands on piporidnct 
Send rtsum# Is Bax 0 * . cM
44*dienB PeFtwLTfNr 4SL_
BOY$ GwH He gw itmif i*ge* 
Chrttfmgt mgney* Perl Hme «gr% 
gvgitgbf* wnmg<nf*fy One week m  
ly Trgmgnggwt egrmngt Iggiigl 
meet mg w«H be hgig gt Mi*ien* iiiifib 
Mgtgi Wnggy O nem gerW e«IB f* 
t^grg iFgrgntt *w6(*m*i »•#• egw 
n«fgg  with H« Hen ^
ftBBO tgmtene fg <er* igr ene tnigi 
Mfgnf m my hgmg tgm* MM 
hevtdwgrk gefw*nx*% Cef**»4

TERRACE GARDENS 
N U R S IN G  H O M E

Is new lokme sppiKStisnt tor 
LVN S tlrp iM t llIrstM t 117 
lull lifttp and rptMt

Apply in person 
2901 W Ohio 

694 8831

P A R T T IM E  HELP
Tbg M>*ien* Aeegi igtign tm be«grge*
C ffitgne W*fi frgm en* certify gggf*«e* 

'ggn «*i* grg gygr 18 en* «  fH * 
nggffhfgbeggwSifter cernggnmnslw

the mgntgNy rgierggg rgrwbref *g*«v 
g ^ tffx  gnjegingfg Fgrenegggmt

nf cell 8*7 *771

IS

B &  B V E N D IN G
vgngmg mgc»giBM freme* Hertmg 
ggy 117* ggr week Mggi bey* teme 
ryigK bgwH g« en* mm trn m eager wbe* 
8gmt cg*H Went g*>mggeg» m 

tgggt iW ?  between 8 en* 13 W i  
«gy fhr*M8g Freddy

B 6  8 Vending 
A ir  Term inal

LVft t. ggrtet efbet kbmr* e**rgge 
we get hfeete egg*y m gerten ner 
m»gb Ledge M Ib  6*gm

aaachTnTsT
E x p e r i e n c e d  m a c h i n i s t  o r  
t r a i n e e  n e e d e d  A l l  s t a n d a r d  
b e n e f i t s  e v e i i a W e  A p p l y ,  
t  5 s F  M  i n c e r p o r a t e d  
C o m p a n y  S  M i d l a n d  O r . 
e B 4  7 7 B 2  A n  e q u a l  e p p o r t w n i  
t y e m p i o y e r  ________

M A C H I N I S T

3 years experience 
own tools 

MACHINE TOOL 
MAINTENANCE AAAN

I  veers experience Abie 
to do some building end 
e le c trk e l maintenance 
Excellent working condi 
tions, group life  end 
health insurance, paid 
holidays, paid vecetion, 
p ro fit sharing plan Apply

Mitiway MarHrfdcturing 
2040 W .Oregan. Odessa 

or call (91S) 362 ̂ 267
An aquai Jiesrtymii amiliiir

West Texes' lergest mov 
ing 6  storage company is 
taking applications for 
warehouse man.

* P a id  V acation
* P ro fit  Sharing
* A ccident &
* H e a lth  In su ran ce  

Call for
appointment: 

563-1461

i

■ xeeB itN C yo rvlnsayaiian man. 
•Ma axoarMntM <ha*t rnwal man. 
Om» aarxint  candn«na stM say.j 
a*4 4l)4ara>4 M4) i.

H A N D Y  HUT
Full tim e help wanted

Must be willine to work nieiits.^ 
netygroph tost eivtn 
botorsa

2210 N.
BIG SPRING

h i  1 0  atanlan) minnar Mr 
cama aaerimenN OMSi sa 
malura marrMd Jib Mr wiN .
MV anty rant tm  utunMa
tsaasii

t I

T T - T'4̂. L



P A C B K
\

\
T in  KfDUND ic ro m t-m Jcc tA M . m t , obc it. itn / V r'l V

^  Classified Want Ad Department Business Hours:
^  ■  m O N  S A n i l D A J ^  W A N T  A O S  M A T  I t

♦ Closed SoturdaysM O N DAY  t im u g li FRIDAY  
OPEN 8 A M  to 5 P M

C O t t i a E O  O t  U N a U E D  B e t m e e a  t k e  

i m u r s  e l  I  a . m .  a n d  1 0  o . m .  o n l y  . . .  N O  

N S W  O R D E R S  W I U  B E  A C C E P T E D  O N  

S A T U R D A Y S .

a w A r s T D P u m o w w A N n i o s ; -

(1) lY  TEEPtOK -  OUL 6I2-6222
(2) AT o u t OEICE -  2011 ILNOIS
(I) n  W A -  P I  0  M l  M U M . J1  T im

HjtojMMM; IS Mt»e«wna: IS Wanicd, IS HeipWtnitO

EARN
WHILE YOU  

LEARN!Pay starts ot S2.75 on hour plus 15‘ 
an hour becouso h is o night job« 3:45 
p.m. until 12:30 o.m. Typing 40 wpm is a 
bosk requirement. .

We hove 9 bosk interesting skills 
and ofter you hove learned eoch one you 
will receive o roise for thot skill. This is 
0 iob with a future, the very newest in 
printing techniques.

Many company benefits. If in­
terested coll the Midland Reporter 
Telegrom 682-S319 ofter 3:00 p.m. and 
osk for Marvin Bishop for an ap­
pointment.

S U C C EED  
W ITH  US!

Town i  CoMVry Shopping C««tor

TAKING APPLICATIONS 
PART TIME FULL TIME

WIOOP ATUNOANTS 
•LINI ATTINOANTS 
•  COOK TIAINirS 
•OISHWASHIPS

COMPANY U iN E F lT I  
(k«wp ln»«K*noo Ponwon Pi«n 
PotO VacWion* Untor

ta r ta n  Equal Opportwrutif Emptoyar M IF

E X P C R I E N C E D

TRUCK DRIVER
lONG f lP f  MAULS M  TIXAS

United Pipe & Supply, Inc.
c J  N r N N rrN w ...

M 2 - I M 7  o r  a H e r  S ,  6 E 4 - 4 Z 7 4
IA«I)M IM )IAIC n iA l

W A N T E D
E K p e r io n c e d

TRUCKDRIVERS
immmmn <*• • amw mn»pf nm -
NiMnM mm MFFramMMMf er»#% MUMf h mmbpi nnwMiH

f9T  AppIkMitOn

Call Collect
Ctwslay Thomas

I M W m  M id land  T re a t rtFOl

(915) 563-3343

THE MIDLAND 
REPORTER-TELEGRAM 

OIL DEPARTMENT
needs c le rk  typ ist for fu ll tim e  job Oil 
co m p an y  experience would be a plus, 
but not necessary C O N T A C T , Joe 
S a lm a n , 682 5311, ext. 143.

WE NEED GOOD PEOPLE 
(MEN & WOMEN)

To supply our fine da iry  products to homes and 
stores. Must be at least 31 years of age No ex 
pericnce necessary Permanent em ploym ent 
w ith  excellent benefits including re tirem ent 
and m aternity berrefits.

Apply at BORDEN INC.,
2405 W . M i s s o u r i

to ta im O w i » ■ •< l  wru r*»

W A N T E D
PARTTIAAE

M ake extra  morrey inserting supplements for 
The Reporter Telegram

Interested Persons Contact
WR. DAVIS

CIRCULATION DEPT.  
____________ 682-5311___________

NURSES
AIDES

' ALL SHIFTS AVAILABLE
<ALl.«35d03

/ D E L IV E R Y  
' W AREHOUSE

Naad Mdividaai iada qaaa d ri* 
inq racard D ritv rry  ant w trli In 
w areaev* Monday taraFridav 

' OoM pay ant btntitrt Cad 
A iTdTm ar tqwairdaiinl

DRIVERS
A p p lic a t io n s  be ing  
ta k e n  fo r  b o b ta il 
d r ive rs  Apply West 
IFoods West Hwy. 80.

STATION
A T T E N D A N T

Matwr*. marriad »«pari«ncM 
only Addiv '

IM PER IAL GULF 
3301N M ID K IFF

Levi Strauss & Co.
NEEDS

Permanent, Ful-Time

SEWING
MACHINE

OPERATORS
No Eiperience Necessory

le t 01 leodt you o trw le  f i f i t  roue comei o fte r 2 
•ynnki ot employment Four r ta ie i during leofoing 
period ficn ile o t teornmg p o iv tx iite i M tff moyx 
medico! ond tx>ipitoiiiotH]n for employeei Nominol i 
tee tor dependent miuronce, retirement plan ond | 
other be n e titi 5 do y i o treek 7 30 4 00 doily M u ir | 
be 10 or older

APPLY 2029 S. 
HOLIDAY HILL RD.

I o c a L I n t e r v i e w s

[>«illil\c, S u ()fR ilN IEN d fN T S
R  IR o I e U M  ENC^i’\£ E R S

W ortd'i leodmg o ttih o re  O'lwell drilling compony i i  
leeking oppiKonts tor the above poiitKxis f *  
per>enced lupeontendenti, w ith o degree m 
petroleum engineering preterred, ond o minimum ot 
3 yeo fi e iperience Im iv id uo li will be m chorge of 
0 group o t drilling n g i in the GuH o f Menco with 
opportun itie i fo r foreign o iiignm ent m the future 
In oddition, it  you ore o degreed petroleum 
engineer or mechomcol engineer with offshore e i 
penerice ond ore interested in emborkmg on o 
tromir>g progrom to prepore for 0 future os o 
drilling supermtendent, we ore prepored to  discuss 

• Our pion with you

We offer steody employment, on eicellent benefit 
program and competitive salary, in addition to o 
wide voriety of interesting work Interviews will be 
conducted at the foUowirtg locotion Pleose coll for
appointment

Mr. A rt Neal 
Monday, December 19 
Midland/Odessa, Texas 

(9 1 5 )5 6 3 -0 1 2 4
I f  unable to  coll please send resume to :

Mr. Art Naal

OCCAM ORALMC A CXPIORATON COMMNY 
>I PO BOxeiTSO

Ml W ORLEANS LOlXStANA FO«1 
L  ANEOUALOmXtTLMTV AFFnMATIVE 
U ACTK3N EMPCOVER M F

l A iin o iiilia  ' .w .g g '

[NEWSPAPER CIRCULATION  
DISTRICT MANAGER

E ic e tle n t opportun ity  lo r a man or woman 
who a n io y l w o rk in g  w ith  young people

’  E ic e tle n t s ti*rtin g  hourly pay
• Com pany p r  kup tru r k lu rn iin e o  
'  E I  c at la n i pack ago ot company benefits
* N o e ip a rie ttc e  necessary w ill tram

kaWf- t t n t a t t

W R D e v il C ircu le tion  D irector

MIDLAND REPORTER-TELEGRAM

[C

N O W  H IR IN G !
NEED TOP

PIPE WELDERS & 
A.S.M.E. CODE WELDERS

Goad pay aid kanefit i

CALL MLL DYKSTRA, 563-1170

NEED DRAFTSMEN
Satory commaMurot* wlh tiparianct

CONTACT ROSS YOUNG OR CA. LOAN

NEED 2 YARD MEN
to work tar growing company Mutt b* eiparianctd with forklift and lomilia «th  pipe ond ttnictimd

" ifs a  Rvad-

RECEIVING 

CLERK TRAINEE
Call S63-1170,lxt. 176

CmPtEIWi IWTHM. WC
L TIXAS P liM  M ) Y17t

6««rh î*i M»ia>e

301 E Illino is Dial 603 S3II

IMflOTMmi
g t - -

III OMt T aw  
m u t t  lOFIMI

«  MQxai a «  ■ I

B r y a n t  B u re a u
i.w. i  .V# WerAew* >

WHIRL fXKUTIVf
CARHRS MCm

60S-ms Ntm.itaa
CAU lotaylm

TAX
ACCOUNTANT

M id la n d  ba ted  public o il and 
g a t  co rpo ra tion  naadi a ta i 
accountan t to  be m charge ot 
a ll m howie la« re tu rns and 
co m p lian ce  lo r  e contro l cor 
p o ra te  g roup  and several 
Itm ita d  p a r tn e r th ip i Re 
q u ire m e n ti a re  a degree 
p lu s  about 7 y e e rt te i  e i 
pe rience  Salary open depen 
d in g  on e ip e rie n ce  end abtli 
ty  Com pany i t  e ipand ing  
r a p id i t y  an d  v e ry  ag 
g r e i i iv e  Sand resume m 
con tidance  inc lud ing  salary 
h is to ry  and ragw irem ants to 
6o i  O }. ca re  ot M id land 
R epo rla r Telegram

CONTROLLER

HIM ' V 

»»(f( i ’ "»

n t t M I M H

D m m k ill
FgtsGtaaa. iiifCt ,

NAf UUKHV 'W

it takifif appRcationt for:

(1) laygrigactd krtakfatl caoki 
-Riar«iRf d iift

(1) txfgriaRcad food fortoaiigl 
• day and night shift.

Sdory open To axparigncad o k I quolifiad opolxxxitt

Aggly daUy 2 g.ai. ta 4 g.M.

2001 N. Big Spring 
684-9417

NATURAL GASOLINE PLANT 
SUPERVISOR NEEDED

tmwwdiai opening tar ncturel getolne plov uperviar m Siawy. Montana aria Mutt 
be fomka •ith geihermg cemgretuen. omme treating and procotsing Somt wpar- 
waryeipariancaraguifed Iwallant lohryaidbantfitpockage

Caatact: ib .  R . iM w i
Parry Gat Caaipaaiad, lac.
P.O. lax 70S9 
(Malta, Ttxai7Y760 
«U-331 4331

M id la n d  based a ll and gas 
c o n tra c t d r il l in g  f irm  has a 
need lo r  e con tro lle r to be m 
Charge ot e ll accounting 
fun c tion s  ol th is  company 
R equ irem en ts  are  an ac 
cou n ting  degree end a pp ro i 
im e te ly  4 yaers e ipe rience  
D r i l l in g  o r serv ice  company 
e ip e r ie n c t  he lp fu l Needs to 
have good understanding ol 
( In a n c ia l a c c o u n tin g  A 
r e p o r t in g  re q u ire m e n ts  
S a la ry  open depending on 
e ip e rie n c e  and a b ility  Send 
resum e in  ron lidence  in 
e lu d in g  s a la ry  h is to ry  and 
req u ire m e n t to  b o i D 7 Care 
o l  M id la n d  R e p o r te r  
T e leg ram

"n o w  T A K IN G  
A P P L IC A T IO N S  

For the positions
usher dcarman (oshier a ats it 
tent manager • •  tha Cin« 
Theatra (presently vnaor can 
structian) Appiy ai site V9t 
Cuthbert tram T ’tiMSam

MANAGER TRAINEE 
&

ASSISTANT MANAGER
EiaerwvKerieeieweerap rv.m« 
noM tattra  pM-iwn Trwmna pis 
or wn laaat to man*a*r>«i Wipwmriv 
MUkt hove car win par IP m>u mrntn 
t* taa E icriiw  irmpi sm nm  la  
drtwat ky vk itr on aw loa traawna 
Ltam  ant tat paW kv it atm w  
roaw**' wvfS'y la iif, Haat •twa 
•maWveet bilk raaaanao<a in 
WUian u i "  WmMiwm ol kipi ynwi 
orGCO

G eneral F inance Corp 
30 V illage  C ircle 

683 473^ ,

Experienced 
Welders 
Wanted 

C all 682 0495
A fte r Scan 683 6737

I BRAKES.
I A L IG N M E N T  
' M E C H A N IC
iCrOOdyear Service Store 
has permanent position 
tor experienced brake 6 

la lig n m en t m echan ic 
,Ability to sell service 
needs to customer is 

le s s e n t ia l  G o o d y e a r  
jben efits  include paid 
[ v a c a t i o n s ,  f r e e  
ih osp ita tiia tion  & in 
Isurance plus pension pro 
'gram  Apply in person a t 
[GOODYEAR SERVICE 
ISTORE,509W WALL
I E qv* Ope»rfu«.*y E mpWyrf
i A P P L IC A T IO N S  

B E IN G T A K E N  
for semi driver with one 
year experience Apply

W E S T  FOODS
West Highway 00 

No phorte calls please
JOB 4v4ti«B*9 fwMNcian
tY4«<W9 ttWtiNf

Oil

K«p49< C«*i 9m |«7 79H
G«« AAap C«m^Y

LVN'S
F o r W estgata M anor Nurs 
Irtg Center Day sh ill. I  to  4 
Top wages Beautifu l new 
hom e A pp ly  in person 7800 
N M id land  D rive  697 3IQ8

DRAFTSPERSON
In cre a se d  pradu ttian  has 
created an opening ter an ei 
panorKod mechamcai strvcturol 
dataller Salary cammemuratt 
with aipericnce Contact Laa 
Smclair Chief Ena ar Oeargg 
HatkOkk Vice errs ot Mtg 
C h a llen g er  Rig Mig inc . 
♦LS i6J«9»L.^
OOtLAP Pant A Car*ara»«ervK»it 
•rnOam « } 's htvr tacawa ai Ap 
tarntnat ■ _

W A IT R E S S  '  
W ANTED DAY SHIFT
AppIV m poroon only, between t 
a  11 AM or after i  PM ta Mr 
Hochman

L U IG I'S
111 N . B ig  Spring ,

IM M EDIATE O P E N IN G S
f  •pa'id-ng U anulactutor O H ott Growth OpfiOflurtil

MACHINISTS
INDUSTRIAL ASSEMBLY
MECHANICS 

WELDERS
CALL COLLBCT |t1  S| SaS-llSS

t a i l  Hwy go p 0 gat 4srg
Odaaia Taiat ttttO

trea
mmt̂ ratrwtna kriean  ana wci laara

d i M E

THE PERMIAN CORPORATION 
has IMMEOIATE o p e n in g s  FOR:

MECHANICS

W( OFFER F>f RM ANFNT EMFnOYMFNT AND A G(XX)
future in a modern truck shop facility

BINEFITSINCLUDE:-
•faU litnaiM »hrlKptn TIri Na
•hM  loBiMalHi hi •faU Uh Ingran 
•f(M  lalin i hggai •Scl h i  Isistaxi 
• fa U IM B is  e h M Is t lM

FOR INTERVIEW & APPLICATION 
CONTAQ JIMMY JOHNSON

THE PERMIAN CORPORATION
G(rden City Hwy, Midland 

Ph(915) 683-4711

SU PER  BOWL 
3920 W. Wall

Need 1 person to w ork counter 5 nights 
p er w eek

and
1 person to tra in  as p insetter mechanic 
6 nights per w eek.

SeeCLINT

EXPLORATIONIST
Oallai koMp tM m ntm t Oil Hodiiiar n tipondng P 'l praiant 
>lkda<41 iplarotiaB athca a d  hai m «aon»"g fa  a pawn anOi S ts 
10 yaan n a w w x t m gadognl and amamte ntaprt.«Nn •>- 
lolvmg iha N riia i lawt with tnang ampkadt ■  <ta Oetmiae 
•oun W ay  ant bantfitt tammantwran mth atparanct

A.6. HILL 01 PRODUCER
1414 WMco Bids.

Nk«oid Ttioi 79701 (91 SI M7 7979
Attanio> D I la d

EX EC U TIVE
SECRETARY

AAust have O il & Gas experience, 
p re fe ra b ly  in engineering  & geology. 
S a la ry  com m enusrate  w ith  experience. 

M A L L A R D  EXPLORATION  
500 Wilco Bldg.

682-8217

L E V I STR A U SS & CO.
N E E D S  P E R M A N E N T ,F U L L T IM E  

W A R E H O U S E M A N
Movrs 7 a  la I ataawaan wwi at Wre*s wa eaw «• ww iwiiin Nravy IM 
tma maolraa vary laU typa t o  data attantanta nacaaaary itartmt rata 
Si l l  hour II or atom t  icrMim k m u n  *ad.v b it  t mociM t ni. .l a o  . 
brkwnni aa n byrw  i

antonatOaatrtttnitttmalarar j

N E E D  M A T U R E  S A LE S P E R S O N  
for' 'T H A T  W O M A N " , a w om an's

speciality dress shop 4(l hours a week but rryust work 
Friday 6 Saturday Hours tO to 6 This is permanent 
employment All inquiries must be made to Bdx 0431, 
iMidland ,Texas 79701 Inquiries handlfd in con 
fIderKe / O '

[ I / ■ . ‘

PULL iHn* irrvKi Kalian attanaani 
AaWyattMS OmSarma
LARGE growing music stort m 
W rit Teias now mtorvowing lor 
Mall Stora Managar Must hav* 
talas aiporlonco and good work 
Ing knowtodgr ot musical m 
ttrumants incentivt program 
Salary commansuralt to ai 
parlance and ability Sand 
rasuma to Boi 0  4 cart Midland 
Raportar Talagr^m

N E E D E D
Hava opaning tor 2 top Una a i 
parlancad matal man Flanfy ot 
work good working conditions 
Contact

C A R T E R  S M IT H  
SACREMENTOCHEVROLETOLOS 

A lam ogordo . New M exico 
_  (SOS) 437 7SM_______
CLERICAL 4 SECRETARIAL 

POSITIONS
r9fuirt5 tyftnf tkill 

rw D O ff fctokiiMpinfWdcItrtcM m 
cewfHeftf eiperitfice ri^om  ptr^ct H
nw cDTYfvder %rnmf pimw
wml fMwme 404 %mmf re^rtment 
H  D $
T*4fyr^
PRODUCTION FOREMAN 

CKabiwhad ■naiot«oi"i M coma any 
has aoamno m narmtn baun araa tar 
tiparwncaO praOuctitn loramtn 
Outwt ta mciuoi Mptrvwan at can 
tract awnp*rs wKl lamautiont 1 
warkevm a inKakatwn at praOuc 
lion lacilltiat IvO campaay konoltti

C o n ta c tG . L . M u rp h y
684 8771

H il l ia rd  O il 6 Gas. Inc

Sales. Agwds
carjirSALES PEeaeSENTATIVE can 

appartynlti wOmo mduttrwl aroaucH 
kigk oartHnat P*v* *1 bmmtt 

Miaiano OOaaaa torntary araa. ilw  
aaattoota m Lubatci Amarma thy 
Wkhna Fam eioaw can taa D*t' 
a n  «t 714 i l l  om

DUNHILL
PERSOfMEL 
OF MDLAND
2X1 NEST NAU

DISTRICT LANDMAN
St>0NC MST nxAS (X
poifiia (xcafto (x
CiFTIONAl B(N(MT 
Pt(KKAM AND AO 
VANCEMENT OPPOtTUNITI

bpAID. 36X

TAX ACCOUNTANT
73 rums PUBLIC AC 
COUNTING EXPERIENCE 
CPA AND ASUT EXauENT 
ADVANCEMENT POTENTIAL

FEE PAID . . .  2TK 
ACCOUNTANT

7 VEAJIS EXPERIENCE IN THE 
Ok L GAS DRtlUNG IN 
OUSTRV DEGRH AN ASSET 
KIT NOT REOUIRfD GOOD 
SEttrriTS

FEE PAI D. . . .  m
CONTACT

nTUISMAISNAU
AT

683-AM6

16 Sates, Agents

CAN YOU LEARN 
TO ASSIST

BRANCH MANAGER?
E a rn in g  po ten tia l S300 a 
week o r m ore For th is op 
p o r tu n ity  phone 337 1437. 
O dessa Ask fo r  V ir g i l  
Hughes

UNIQUE
OPPORTUNITY

lo o  AAcdkal Scrvica the largest 
supplier el first aid stations and 
supplies in the United States 
neects a person to sell new com 
m ercials and industrial accounts 
and to sarvice e i  1st ing accounts 
in and around Mldland'Odessa 
W t art looking lor o txtnest 
hardworking person interest m 
making an outstanding living 
E icellent local references will 
be required and you must be bon 
dabic Plaase send a resume to 
Zee AAedical Services Boi 1S3I. 
El Paso T eias 79073 
WANTED tatatoaopia man ant 
women lor lev poKiwnt w home end 
autocar areOucH CaiiatialM

17 Situations Wantcif
GKADUATI Acc«wM4f«l 12 
pcriffKr p«ft time m
•Of* ___________
SKCKEtAOV H
(ffe TyfFCif 10 iNpm ^lortnM ID 4 
f0m% t%$mtmKf m itm ah 

m««M nevtf nil M M 
eucefifM rvftrencM C*H

Ffipiern
f w i i^
a t o t i j

10 OiiMCare
LICENSED CMM cart day 
arapUH wetcamt 
Pwan an  lu t

a«e 194 W

Art you a itanogropha dork 
typtlt m keypunch eperotat Tour 
skiih ere noadod now ot

ADIA PARTME
Taoparay lardaat 6B3-6tn K>{ 1M4 W «WI

i p '
MWEST 
lERSONNEL 
’ OERVICES

407 KENT 683-4221
M H 'Y "

11 Child Care Service
LICCNSSO chtid car* Nifhtt *fi0
w**»*fKH 0 11482 3382____________
PRIVATE itc*o9*d child car* my 
ham* Orop ifH wakamt t*f«r*f>cat 
418 S Colorado
CAN pick wpchildran aft*r tchocM will 
k«ap after 7 M m*6 every n»fht 
497 SH7
WOULD like to babyiil 7 ar 3 children 
weehdavt lavinpcar* lifiWettKen 
nicky

W______ Business Opportunities
BEEN tiv r n for rant, can 494 84M

RESPONSIBLE 
PERSON

Wanfad to own and aparat* candy 4 
cofMactian vaod»n8 ravte Mtdiand 4 
wrravndinf araa Pfaaaant av«fnen 
HH|h profit itama Can ttan part timt 
Ate ar experience not important 8e 
<iu«ret car and 81288 88008 caeh invatf 
mtnf Ear dflatlfwrife 4 tnciwde yagr 
phone OeuteOept 11740 •oico* . 
Sun vaiiOY Ca 91B7 ar call <7131 
H7 5404

/

O

LOUNGE  
FOR LEASE

Inquire 8 6  0 Vending Company

563-0163
BE COME 4 loom Msuietion Ctrarac 
tor OeatersNas now evaiiaote w 
Mtdtant araa \ m m  ttU

i

1970

ondi

M q I

WANT *0 
LEASE y 
Laaoo V 
494 4441

TC

for clean
smaHer
VkontoH
NICKEL

197? Skfl 
Sport Cou 
H7S Fon 
ipw mile 
roaoonaP* 
1977 Corv 
iht*<ior 
Canto w  
1975 Graf 
roof and 
48? 9387 
POP tale 
$00 at 
Ciaanari 
1974 Cadfl 
ctflant c( 
87258 Cal
1974 Pont 
lewmiiaj
1973 Piffi 
top Each 
condition 
$500 dewf 
Vopa E 
miioat* I
1975 Mom 
brak08. a 
AM FM 9 
afttr4

Cadillac 
fanwtWHi 
1954 Cad 
rtfforini.
1974 Far 
cyTIntfori 
pOwwttp 
1977 OpW 
Pum «ith 
attar 4 
ONE pan 
pawar. ai 
$3185 494

( I

V w» .va .0 ^ . gs.s



m  ADS;-

L 682-6222 
E.1UMMS 

im,nnm

structuroi

1 nn

HILL
ONNEL
IDLAND
ESTNAU

LANDMAN
ST TfXAS W 
M G tftO  (X 

B IN fM I 
AND AD 

OPPWTUMITI

....36X
COUNTANT

PUM.IC AC 
fXPJRIfNCf 

» T  (XCdUNT 
TNT POTfNTlAl

. . .  2W

UNTANT
tRKNCE IN TH< 

DtllUNG IN 
D»H AN ASUT 
KXJIRfO GOOD

. .  . .  18K
NTMT
;IUISIMU
AT

M 8 «

.ttnofroRlwr d«rt 
imcN aptroNr^ T«ir 
•d  now ax

PARTME
rwy tara lan
101 1M4 N «MI

Child C tn  Service
•Id car* 
At2 131?

and

n«*d child car* my 
w^k am* Maftrtocat

iidraA aftar Khoai «nii 
JO aad aytry niahl

/ V
I

M e e w y *  31

>■ /
T H l  M ID U N D  t t r O U T t K  T t U tC H A M  B A T , M tC  IT, » n _ / i / r««xic

M e mobile t n

o

babysit J ar 3 chitdran 
>g cara i f f l  Watt Kan

tinessOpportvmities
>f rant caiT u n  _
» 0 N S IB L E
E R S O N
‘ and adarata candy i  
ftnd ravta Midland 4 
aa btaasant avvnaM 

Can start part »ima 
net nat impartant da 
liMMOOOcaahinvatt 
its wr ita 4 mclwda yaar 
apt nnodoscaab ivd . 
a t)» 7  ar call (2 in

JNGE
LEASE

I VeiTding Compeny

3-0163
Mm NttKidian Cantric 
0% ntm avtil«M« M 
I MO xn<

\

IW H Y ^ ,

All used cor prices hove been dros- 
tico ily cut to  move 'em out Inventory 
MUST K  REDUCED H ury to  Rogers 
fo r Super Sovings on the moke model 
and terms you wont and select your A- 
} Used Cor from one of the largest 
stocks in West Texos

BANK RATE FINANCING 
ARRANGEll ON-THE-SPOT1977 FORD GRANADA 4-OOOR...........‘5495

fcRtramaiy law iwtas Vŵ y. ytry ft<a Stock No 30(01976 fORD ELITE 2-DR. HARDTOP___ »46951976 FORD PINTO 2-OOOR.................. ‘2995
4 cyiindw ingint nth 4-tpMd Air conditioMr, radio Only 16 000 miln Slock No1975 CHEVROLET MAUBU 4-DOOR. . . .  <229$

iconcmicol 6 cylwdir Egweetd Low wHooeo S»«cl< "» 132W_______________________________1973 CHEVROLH NOVA 2-DOOR.........M895
VTUutomolic, peoor itotring, rodio, tiMod gliat, WSM tiroi, ohool covors Root doon Stock No1975 ^CAT SQUIRE 2-DOOR WAGON <2995
kAirciry. VI, 4-ioood, rodio, tmod glau. WSW tiro», Mwol covort. low miloogt Slock No t067A.1976 FORD RANCHERO PICKUP...........‘4595
VI. «rtemolK, powor tloonnt/krMoi, oir. rodio. low twiloi Stock No 6017A___________________1968 CHRYSLER "300" 4-OR. HARDTOP ‘1095
M ty  oquRpod ond EXTRA N ia  CAR Slock No 94SM

NICKEL
U SEDCU S
MantFladi

1*77 lORD I  ID  4 I j
o i- r - a * .  »  powr c io o 'x f 
oow»' brokoi 'tnjio w •» I
l-ock ptayw Sie*S

1*73 fORO Sio*-.)" I k i j j -  
outomolic 0* powM*
Bowr lyokoc oood and ciom 
'M d * i<y i '0 « i  sm s

1*73 PpNUAC Vm^'uro 7 doQi 
HdiclibKk auK)m«ir pow*'

DOW*' br(A«t Or
sm s

W73CHTVROU? Copr-cr 74oo 
•w riiop  oiliom ol* a r pow*' 
V rtfni) pow*’ brok»t AM 
'dd«>XlM trO O S)S*S

1*74 BDICK Apollo ?dspr 
ou»omoi< pow*’ and Oi' -<idio, 
0 oic* ithooi car SI7«S

l*7S CHtVRatT Moni* Corlo 
oil o r  ond powtr ci*an and K)w 
m.leog* S37*S

1*66 PtYMOOTH VIP 4 door 
i*dv> V I *nfin« ooiomoi'C 
oow*< sifO'ing pow*' brokOi 
O’ rodro, nic* v lw o l c »  S3*$

1*06 lORD Go<aii* SOO 4 door 
Wdon V I om om t^i pow*- 
v t t 'n g  pow*' b inkc i o r  
'*a n c »  SS*I

1*64 CMfvROUI P'cVup V I 
#ogir>* s’ andord tronwi'cvon 
me* comp*'on bock d 'lvotond 
'un t good I72S

"T il*  Cr*w tW l f  * r * i ' '

SEVERAL NICE 1 9 n  FORD LTD’ s
Good colors, well equipped, good prices. SEE THESE TODAYI

for May Bnwtr, Don Woetta or L§s ta«ow

">Jic ^DeoJ" ... Come 0V

ROGERS |S I S i|

SPECIAL OFTNEWEEK 
Ntw 'TIOpil

a«cb n* If*  tn  c»«a« «p**> aaiavy •«••
OMiMn y —r a« Kofevi 4<v*neB 
‘kDcc ir *  rwei| H Mi#My m4 li
0*>

SPEQAL PRICE S3553 
V2S3IW I 

K K p a ii t l i*
*4?M»4*rw« •' ID an  wa 9«a'
Dmq MViwap *i*M m '<e«*e yOki(• nmi -z’ a* pm4 V a# '

UOAN-nOTNERS•uia-opii
s s e w i  » 4 in e W I7 H I

4200 W est H w y 80 694-8801 563-1125

USED
aRs

VlUAGELINCOlR-MERCIMY
n iS W .M oN  M 7 I1 IS

END OF THE YEAR
WHOLESALE
TO THE PUBLIC

"Cash Only" 
you SAVE MONET-RE M«E TAXES

1*66 CHRYVER Nrwporr 4 door 
te d ir  S7I0
1*74 PIYMOUTH Fury 4 door 
Mdon. V I ouiomoK o r 
paw*- S650

1*56 CHEViaET 2 Ion Truck 
4  tpofd Irany ii’kkion 2 tp**d 
roor *nd S1090

l* *7  CHfVRaET kfwola 7eoor 
Mprdlop. V I. OUlpmOlK powor 
I 'c t r n g  pow*r brokec S725

I* * *  MERCURY Momogo 4 dr 
Mdor V I ouromol'C pow*' 
V ffT 'n g v 'd  brokok o r  S3H

1*70 CHFVtaET P'Ckup \S 4 
lp * td  t'anvnisvon rtxAo. com 
p*r comptr hot ito v *  bunkt 
ondic* boi 5150

1*60 FORD Ronch*ro 6 
cvlmder Honckrd irw itm 'itkM  
rent good S4I5
1972 CHEVRaET hnpala 4 door 
M doi V I. oulomolic. powor 
t 't t r in g  pow*r broAtl o r. 
rod« 5565
1*71 MFRCURY V I ouiomaiic. 
o r, powor t'««ring Bid brakot 
rod« S3I5
1971 CNEVniE 24oor hardtop
6CY''nd«r. tlondo rd  Irp n t 
mtuion .rodo  nc«dt Front bum 
P*r 7'R  ond rodmlor. bodY Bid 
mgior B *  tohd S5I5
1*76 HOMFMAOE Comp«r 
TrBl*r hot bimkt t'O ** < * 
bo> 0 Ol«r hvttCr’t  tpCCiOl

S365
I*69C mFVR(XET htipolo 4 door 
V I. oiXomotN pow*r tttorm g 
and brakot o r  $54*NICKEL

O U A U T V  U S E D  C A R S
Main A Florida Dial 682-5734

"THE atlW  THATCAffS”

W ANTtobay iwnhca*-* Call041331 
LEASE yaur car ar tfiFCk From Nkkai 
Laaaa 37tS ^  Wall Nancy Dunlap 
$94 m i ____________

TOP PRICES  
PAID

tor clean lata mortal mtarmartiata and 
amailar cars (raa btrtt Cantaci 
Vkanta HinoTMat
NICKELCHRYSlER PLYMOUTH 

3ASW Will
1*7} Skylark Cuttom I  i 
SponCoup* C«II4*< TAPS
107S ro ro  E lit*  Okcoilont canditwn 
tow mlloop*. cl*on le*d*d Pricod
r»»«or>«p l* C»ll«*}T?t*___________
1*7? Corv»n* Silvor with r*d l** lh*r 
m i*rio r LOW m il* * **  Fully le*d*d
C * lite t« * .r t?  1*40_______________
1*75 Grand Pri« t l lro r  with maroon 
root and in larlor Laadad Akutt toll
*« T I3 « 7 _______________________
FOP tala 1*14 CMC van low miioa** 
Sa* at JSI) YY liiin a lt Tonilh
Claartor t  4«3 MW __ :__________
1*7aCadillac D *V M i*;**o r coup* E> 
c *tl*n t condition MOM milot Only
t7TM Call 4*4 I7M_______________
i*7* Pontiac vontur*. automatic, air
low m il* * * *  Call *94 IWS__________
M7J Plymouth Satotm* I  door hard 
top Factory a ir JUanoin* EtcaiMol
condition Call 443 ISM '________
SIM down tako up paymontt on 1*77 
Vapa E k tr*  goad candHian low
m itaagt k*7 l*3 t ^___________ __
1*7$ AAont* Cano powor *t**rmo ana 
brakat. a ir n*W * l* * i batwa. radum 
AM FM tta rae  Tap condition **3 77*7 
attwf 4

uYVi-
CaSillac 
tan 1 th  
t«S4 Ca«

cc 4

A lt  1*7$ Eldorad* 
, i ia ty  laadad AAMaliic

Nattigr  intoripf t>4 1**l __
(*$* CddIWdc MdM4l6», *“
u to r in p . S4M. Cdtl 404 7M$
N7A F i d  AdUtanp ^  
cyttndar «npNid. 4 tp **d  tran»mH dn 
odworttodrind. tdctdryair 4*4 *W4 
l * n  Opdt l * * i  * * r i* t  p M  k c h i;  car 
Runt watt praat t a t  mWaap* 4d7*$77
attar t__________ _______________
ONE ownar t*7t MOP* van N k* 
paw**, d ir naw t>r*» A barpoM at 
S 3 m t* < « in

1977 CHRYSLER 
CORDOBA

W tiito  la a th e f in to r io r , fu lly  
lodddd S6300 Sac a t
Aladdin House Furniture 

694 M49
IOtT  Plymouth Fury, S0.*00 m ilat 
powor ttfo rino  and brakat air candi 
ttontnp Call 4*4 i*03
1*77 Datiun waoan Atptad clai 
rad io . 4 track  luooao* 
aconomkal 403 IS74_________
FOR ta l*  by ownar 1*77 Lincoln Can 
ilnantal E ifrac ioan Call4*« 3744
1*44 Econotin* van * k . AM FM 
ttarae. naw carpat batt ol**r avtr
tOM 4074 VY m in t ,  4*7 $477_______
1*74 OMtmobil* Om*o4 Hakhbtck 
m u tt M il WhoioMi* prk*d. II7$4 
403* W Hllneit. 4*7 $477____________
1*74 Ford E lit*  powor and * lr  AM 
FM  with lap* 40 46 la a lt I7 lt$  4074
VY lllm o it 4*7 $477
1*74 ChavTolat Impala lour dotr $pon 
Sadan powm’ and air $7l*$ 4074 W II
lino it. 4*7 S477___________________
1*71 Mont* Carla, pawar ak *< lr*m * 
iv n k *  $777$ 4034 W linnatt 4*7 S473 
1*71 OMI CutlaM $upr*m* 7 d*or 
hardtap Loadad 443 >074 ar 447 *1*|
1*77 Cadillac Coup* Doviit* L * 
Call 443 7076 ar 447 *7*1

I  r

Ch r i s t m a s ”  ̂
SPECIAL

1977 C a in a ro , 1 fu l l  
power and a ir. 6500 
m iles. $5200. Please 
c a ll 684^815.
MU$T to ll 144 cubk kkh  0**61 Dart.
1*74 madtt At*ar S 0*4 *771______
1*77 C*rv*t1* 4.M6 miMt. n*v*r 
r *p lt l* r *0  catnM tr trad* tar r* * i 
a*ta** At*a*4*ndw»»handt 4*41*44 
WIPE ’S paroatiat 1*77 CbdlWac l.fM  
m it**. loadad with antral a t m i  *4 
da E lapanc* m iarid r WaakOaya 
$bj6P$S Attars Odn i i  MO 1161

I . t

3205 N. Wall "y*.*«d.i*ff atiw," 6S4-7741 a SB3-1479

8DiltaMSiiaa
m eoteM rw
H im M ie i

8  CaiiliK Satos
IkM dt IN M

S4250

SSAVE

8 Cistoa Cfiisar S/W

8  OMs n
w im m

74 FI«twao8 Irottliaa

74 PlyNitk Fan IH
S io i e iH M i

8  ForH Sta Watw
CeMytRitn

ED
GRISWOLD
IlS M K t
G94-S7S0

12/12
»e«a> laOTOMmt COtb MT MW

S44SR

WILLIAM
SEALES
liygH Kf
694-1346

73 Tarawarto i iv a  an btwa new tirat. 
ntca car l l l J l  Sat af Paean Crave
AAabiF# home barii Saacw i 9$̂  7tSi
CLEAN laaa Corvette 
avtom atk 
tlfa»  483 77H

atr new rartta*

MUST aeti 71 AAG Mtrtfpt new fire t 
wtre wtteeU and U vw  TrHte 9m 
mm$ inlermation. caFI at? OdH
tf7S Coutar XK7 learted etectric «wn 
real AM EM . tterea ttMl fn warranty 
at4 5tS?otters

S P E C I A L  S A L E
1976 Pontiac Catalina loaded 
1976 Dattun pickup

........................... extra nice
1973 T B ird loaded
1973 Toyota Celica St loaded
1971 Chevy fmpala loaded
1970 Olds 9 8 ................. loaded
These c a rs  m ust sell before Jan 
1 W ill help  finance  o r finence 
m y s e lf
697 4106 or after 6 30 683 $738
H70 Ford Oaiawte Fewer atr pead 
paint very clean aa?6H7
T97S Dadpw cuttom AAaii wafon Out 
fitted w ith new interior. V I all power 
and a ir. Michelin tire t etc M3 77T7 
days, <94 0i»7 mphtt ata tor Data 
1974 Monte Corlo V I. power ttaermo 
and braket A ir Almost new fia s t 
belted rodiais Sky root bucket teats. 
AM FM stereo tape corvsote vary 
foodcondition M3 7 iu
OWNEF. 71 AAOt Good motor tires 
Sot 1303 N Mam M3 49?s after s and 
weekends
19SI Chevy ? doer 377 v  I  late model 
runn in f pear stock enftne tl.OOO
094 7715_____________ ^
1977 Oodpa van Custom AM FM I  
track. TV. loadad After s call. 
007 5»79
1974 Gran Torina 4 daer low miieopr 
17.900 Cloon 1974 Copfi. air cendi 
tioned tl.OM 497 7473
19H O tdi Cutlass S 390 V I automatic 
a ir. AM FM tape M3 3799 or at? 4137 
7004 W Kentucky
1977 X 19 Fiat loaded lets man 3900 
miles CallOtona 913 397 34t?
F 0 8  sale 1949 Thgnderbird m ev 
caMtnf condifton May b t seen at 4309
Versailles Midland
MUST «t*l 1977 Mercury Covpar 
XP 7. 4,000 miles loaded AM FM 
tape crutsa 464 7714 after 3 and Sun 
days WHI b a t t 3700 W Ohio Saturday 
1073 Ford ftation wapon crvtta con 
WM pood tire t M OOl miles itlOO
407 4 0 0 0 ______
1977 Ford wapon Torine Spuire 
laOeddi 34.000 miles EicetiaMf conpi 
tlort New f ires t l 491 343 7M4

JUST IN T IM E  
FOR CHRISTMAS!

1971 Red Mustang 
Good Klieel car 351. v I. 
•utompflc^ dir cenditten*r 
power ttdtrhte pnd brakad 
bucket itpts. Topt. Ct S1565 
6U 4513

1947 Mustanp 4 cylinder standard 
shift M9S 444 4133
1074 Porsche 914. 7 0 anptnr clean ap 
pearanca praup AM FM  • track 
S4700 M7 lIJSevemnps

B E A U T I F U L
1973 240-Z

See to appreciate. Call 
682 6604 AM FM radio. CB. 
a ir  con d ition ing . 46.000 
m iles, W ill sell below dealer 
p r ic e _________
19M Cadillac, clean runs pood new 
tires S093 M3 1004 after 7 
1943 Cutlass O td t. very clean new 
tires, runs pood peod condition 
reducod 494 0774
1949 T p ird  4 door iondau top a«l 
power inciudinp seots cruise tm 
steer inp wheel simufattd chronw 
wtre vWwels see to appreciate Good 
p rte t peed corvrtition Call 497 I4t9
1973 Pueck Limited very clean and 
l« a M  14 000 Can M3 4472 after 3

STATION
WAGONS

1975 Pinto
LOADED 

1977 Malibu
683-2000

197’6Buick
Regal

F u lly  equipped, low mileage
Call694 4036or seeat

4518 Graceland
1974 l TO troupham 4 daer hardtop 
Loaded M ao seats tiH. cruise AM 
FM  Entran ic f  M3 7491
1947 Delta I I  Otdsmobiie white with 
black vmyt top May be seen at 3317 
Cuthb tr t  497 3993 er 444 7797 
1974 Dttsun 7M i. 4«r conditioned 
Speke wheels, a speed cassette tape
14700 Call 444 4000 _____
1973 Chevrolal Monts Carlo Small V I
A ll power and aV 494 OSOa
1937 Chevrettt bet Air 703 V I.  recant
overhaul PpOr very ciaan Camptett
Sae at 804 Canypn after 5 fM  and
weekends y
74 Granada flOOO rmies evWa clean
loaded Sae at m\  w  i f ^ e j
1971 Subaru 1S90 at9i 1949 vMl tasmack
not runntnp U 9 0  3007 harm P
M3 1793 ____ ______
F '6 i sale ar trade ̂ 7 7  Wberu. 4rtoM 
or l973Chevre«ef 4deer CaM494|7i4
197P O vfM '. 4 cylinder eveettem cen 
omen 71TW sterey 40? iM3. 407 972?

Oedpe Van M iy  corpetad with 
bed M back mapwbeeis pewir steer 
mp and pdwer brjehes 497aoit ar
404 47m  after 4 9 _________ '
107a ttand i 4 speed. a«r ii.oo i mites 
497 4001 er 404 4714 after 4 W

TreefcsiTre^tars 31 T rveksiT recten 31 Trucks iT r i I ' 31 Y rN cksiT recU niS I T re cb & T re c fin

1978 FORD F-100
PICKUPS

MOST
WANHD
COLORS Slock Nos 53*1, 5338, 532*. 53U, 5306

6 Cylinder Engine 
Power Steering

Extra Cooling Package 
Instniment Gauges

Tinted Glass 
Auxiliary Gas Tank

*295
DOWN TRADE

plus TTiL

Choice o f 5

SALE PRICE ONLY $4250 Only 
$295 00 down cash or trade plus TT&L 
42 monthly payments of "nly $1 18 85 
with approved credi* APR l'3 61 
Deterred payment price $5491 33

LISERAL ALLOWANCES 
FOR TRADE-INS... 

PAID FOR OR NOTI

On-The-Spot 
FINANCING 

AT BANK RATES

^  0̂ 'Hor.r/c TVif . . .  Cm ^

ROGERS I B g g
4200 W. Hwy 80 694-1 FROM.

ODESSA 563-1125

30 Awfomobim
ifT^Grand Fn« a b T ^ ^ h K e e  tape^ 
cruise 1H1 wdwet ra lly  wheals
497 M lta fte r 3__________________
l9S4Chfyster Siacylindar autematK 
Ewcellent cendil»en Kan W hitt
487 7|4 7 e r443 MM 31.791 _________
1974 Corvette M  T tap a ipaed Cati
4«7 4444 ___________

ISM Ferd Cerftna lave an pas 73 
mpp Will se ll.to r MOO Mas 37« 4  
mites 173 South PantweM 
FOP safe 1973 PuKk wapen mr candi 
tkoner fvH power wrth AM F M stereo 
tape much more 179M 497 7774 ar
M3 4347 ________
FOP sake M Fiymauth Valiant 4 
speed V I  AAator runs pead and has 
paod body 3190 M7 33II ask far 
Wenrtefi bttween I  and 4 31 
le i i  Fantiac LaAAant 4 deer clean 
paod canditwn power and a«r 1444 
494 4SM Number 7 AAartner  Ceurt 
1974 Cemet 4 deer 4 cyifnder 
avtematec a«r and power AM FM  
tape ewtra nke 37791 7441 Appgesow 
weekends M _m *9kdaj^ after 3̂
74 Gafai*# 4 dear power ••eennp and 
brakes air conditioner Vlawtemafic 
^ J 4 M _  _____ _______
1973 a'm c  ipo rtM aut loaded 11744
1144 Sparks 442^19 __________
FIAT 1744door sedan 1974 with 73144 
m iie t AM FM radfO  air wead prain 
dash awceiient canditian 11444
494 7144 _____ _ ___________
i f 7? Monte Carki lae to appreciate 
Call 494 4 ^  w  49^7m  ______
1974 Puick automatic power au 
cruise corrtroi t i l t  steermp wheel e*

1970 Okn Delta lO 4 poar sedan Air 
pmwer Good condition 494 7457 
1HS O td s n ^ ie  runs r9 0 t  paod
tires awceiient work car 1190
444 9491 a97 3434
1977 VW. 1140 and taka aver 74
inch ten speed bkycle US 3143 W
M nsas *9722*1 ,  ^
1973 Mark IV all factory aptions ^  
eluding rnopnroof and built m C8. 
39 044 miles Must seU beiow book at 
17104 M 7IS 1
1977 Corvette all aptians irKiudtrsg 
built in C i.  3 444 mites 19410 447 4 « l 
1974 Fontiac Sunbifd 14 MO mites sun 
roof, power and air Vinyl raat 13 940 
497 3M3

‘8CNE1RDinWTM
bKkvB. long <n4t bad 

comoar. rod« on* Ok*>*i

*2895y | P tR M IA N
I PONTIAC

32 4 W itfel Dr VtHKIts
1977 Chevraift cnevenne Short w»«e 
4 wheel drive 8ia<k with rad ihtermr 
Pali bar iiphts afl tarram fues and 
whaeis UNO Caff Oaup 4944444 
after ?pm#94 7714

Molofcycti

^ O O iK  Woll ^  464 3611 ^

31 TruclisATrK lors
1974 Chevralef - .• ton power and air 
ISO VI. tang wide bed. heavy duty 
packape whoiesafepfKt 494 703S_

1977 F O R D X L T
hpavy duty W fpn mppr cab. all 
avaitablp Ford factory ophom 
Including A M F M  itarao tape 
and CB combination with a 
cam pp f ihpll Immaculate. 
16.900 m ilti Original cost 18700, 
will take 16800 firm See at 1401 
W_LouiiiafU (X call 447 9644 
44C hevr^  ttonpKkup 1973cabovef 
camper fully eguipped Dual YUhaeis «n

MUIT m i 1973 Chevretef Scoftsdaie 
pood condition Can 447 4493.

1974 Ford ewptarar pKHua Loadea 
17.4M M7 P 1 I after 3 FM 
1947 Chevy v tan short narrow bed 
17M 1949 Fprd t«n van windows afl 
around 11M4 Pam m ppad candstien 
M J j 9 H ^ P n

1947 Chevy pHkup 743 tnp*ne 19*» 
447^47M
1974 >« GAAC pickup M0 4bprre> C«r 
497 1473 e v e m ^
73 Fprd F 940 two fan Ppcpnr *ipned 
like new Far infarmatian cart aoer > 
p m 0^4779
47. ^  ton Chevy 3 wihdpw 14 * fan
Chevy 43 ’ « ton Ford I M  each m 
best offer M3 44M AMer 3 M3 474? 
MUST sell t t n  ' I ten Chevy Solid 
Mock rhrpme wheels UMdPwn lake 
up payments 4741 pawn 4*7 I M  
MUST sew 1977GMCl«erra Classic 
ton M l power with efechK m napws 
door locks AM FM. tape and C8 low 
mileape 444 7734 after l  and j wwdays 
Saturday w ill be at im w  Ohuo 
GOOD trailer, bad vre  4 tppf l  inches 
by 7 . foef Good l i f ts  4 piy a iH is  
117^ 494 3434
FOP sale 1973 Ford pickwp pood cWi 
ditipn has been everhavied loaded 
73.004 miles 1 owner cm tlM 4 
494 7773 _  _ . ,
1974 Ford X L t crew cab 1 ten w.th 
power air automatic cruise AM FM  
tape and camper she«i 74 040 miles 
ppad c o ^ itia n  394 v i  Can M3 3403
afterS 3 0 ____
•44 797 7947 ts fM  Tall Free number le 
call for mfo on an k inds af heavey duty 
trucks wirtch trucks Ubeds 73 fa M 
fan a same with rpiimg ta ils 

i drgpdetks tankers iipht const egu'p 
(PaliefS barkhoes draporw p rM fr I D7 daier eft 1 F lot beds spec »ai types 
of tra ilers Over 43 trailers i  over M 
trucks an aur lot in Crass Flams 
iahnsfan Truck
99 Fprd pickup fppd running candi 
l i ^  M3 43W
4 ^ t ^  aluminum bP* vans M7 7799 
70 Ppneherp runs ppod some body 
dpmape 7 ii w  Storey 447 »N3 
447 9777
M  imernafionpi ten dependable 
work truck. 1493 M7 9943 ar M7 9777 
711 W Starty
1973 Ford Cdurter 4 speed air 
497 4M1ar AM 47M after 4 39
1973 * > Ian Ford Panper x l T pickup

197? Yamaha Y2M 0 mm* bikf 
ceiiant conditian 4S4 Greenbrair 

4**9̂  1 h9F9®k|t
y AAAAMA 1974 Y |X  IMfc d*rl bike 
F ■celient canditian One pair sue 
Mataerpss Yamaha leathers I h 
cellantiandition 494 laOJ 
1974 OT 714 W iuki etcefient ;andi 
tipn rww fairmg tires sissy bar F us* 
11734or offer Can 4M ttU  
FOP sale new to'?? iT Yamaha 1?V- 
d in  bike 43 fata* miies Can after i  
097 7474 it no answer 4*4 9049

FOR SALE
? Kawasaki motorcycles 
less than a 1000 miles 
Will sell as one or both as 
a team
Call 684 6851 or 682 6486
7 ntm Kaoataki <M an* >1 CC 
Kawataki *•) undar nnatau i* Ca"
y ^ a  $* }  laaiar 0 «a«a»t$ $H vu : 
1*7$ M oto  O u i l l  l$b T w ind iam  
m * r  la rg *  b ag* nniti r a i l*  c r*$n 
b a r *  dU h o rn *  D oorbeard* 
S ll« $
H onda  7SO I t tc ln g  and b a g t M 
r t a r  yy*>«*I. t ic a i la n i  condition 
S10*5
1171 Y a m a tt*  17$ EnduroS77$

68 2 8 301
1977 K A W A S A K I

R8crtatl«naiVfM cin

Peace on Earth

KZIOOO

1973 Chevrolet Luv pirkup 4 speed 
standard fransm»ss«dn radio M7 1744 
O f 494 m 3 a fte r4  __ ________

t w o  1972 
C h e v r o l e t

h ta v y  d u ty  r ig  up tru c k s  w itn  28 
to n  w inches. d u D ilia ry  tra n s m it 
Sion & o il f i« id  bods Can b * *•»*< 
d t M id la n d  M  O il C o . 1612 
C a rd a n  C ity  H w y . M id land

_____ 682-9404
r*7$ Chavy oKkuo 6 \r i in d * r  lahd 
(**<*•* bat* YWWHM i* RTk* IM N  
May k* • * * *  *1 M **i raada. w mwv 
M .H M iaod _ ^
1*71 Chavroiat Rdku* and canw** 
Eaca llant (onixitldn Ikravdkav*
$*$l$77 . _____
1*76 Ford F 756 1*6 anoin* * taaad 
f«ddf ly nyw tM ^  $>.7$6 667 >l$6 
H77 Chdvralif $Hv*r*dt trtm  edb 
pkkud  Fbw ir Haarino and kraka* 
autamatN. ak Cfndit^anwt W  v 6 
c ru lM  cantral kn**d e * * t  AM FM 6 
track ******  tu t'm a n n a  «n**t low 
m llik ta  I *  71i 66* >M6 /

A ir ponwf radio $1**$ «•* 7*
1*7* Chavroiat . Ian piciiu* Lana 
w id* kad 7*0 V I  ptmtr air 
automatic Ftioo* 6** ^ 2  
1*7$ Fard Rantar F lio  E>c*«i*nl 
canditian A M FM  6 track C i B iO *
mita*  •**■  karoau^ **< 77**_____
1*74 Faro F IdO 7 iaii «».t*i It ' ti 
r*trio*ra«*d van kadv i*  fta d  c«ndi 
tion tasoo M aykataanal w*«i Feod* 
W Hwy Ip. Midland (y u it tx  7$1̂
7*66 ChavroM RKku* «norli»M *M d 
V 6 avtomattc. c l**n  and rumaaod
U$0 0 7 M ^  ______ _ .
1*64 F*rd  ' I t in  rfkwTt 6 cyltndar 
tttnda rd . c *m **r than last 4*4 417$

4 Vhitel Dr Vehicles
1971 Traveiafi four imaaf drive pisi 
tree fbur fpaed lour dMr Air conw 
tipfier pdwor steerma power brakes 
radial Pres. US v I #7 Mi 
1974 Tpypfa Land Cruiser lm# new 
cppdftidn Ufed oH road twice I7 M4 
mites has tiiras lf9M 17M 
^ ip w a j i
ONE of a kMd f977 4 wfiodf Wivp 
Pamchanppr 9 744 mites Fufip, 
cuofamifOd AMFM • track sferoa 
CB.dipftaficidtk CaP447 4997

i
4 144 miles W raafer lu g fp t  ^Kk 
adiusfabie back rest crash bar «nth j 
highway pegs This mpkprcycie is m  ̂
flawless cpndriian better man new ,
11 993pr 91 OlOandtakeuppayments |
If iMerested please ran 09? J444 ask
fpr VK
STPFET bike eecaitent eondition 
bargain at l4 io  Suiwk> GT730 
M7 4471 494 7 ^
FOP safe. 1977 HondaGL MM fairmg 
baps rack sissy bar 17.7M miias 
494 I1P3_
1973 34^P  Husgvarna erceiiam c9n 
ditian never raced Pew iT C  shorks 
eranpedofpisfan new tires sprockets 
and Cham Large fork crown bearmps 
Days 343 7433 After 9 and weekends 
J47_U34
FOP sale Hechet boots sire 10 191 
bell P T helmet 9«  bem 979 
097 4904
H 79 Yamaha MX 179 d irt bika Great 
condition 494 9497

Let UB remember 
the (rue spirit of 
Christmoa and en­
joy a peaceful holi­

day filled with love.
• * * *  7 e y *  a ■ * * !

BILLY SIMS 
TRAILER TOWN
s »  L  m > . oonsA

(Caf»ar M .
M ktk in fiiM .)

337-6635

31 Hicrwtiowi ViBkUi

SeaBom Greatfaft

h U iB lM ia la M iB e s  
■ U H N nW IbW  

IwallulIrsWlralvi
fills ai naianss 
UKSalSinCI

lillT Slat Tnila Tan 
92IEM.Ibsa 

87-MB

I I  ft Cabbvdr 1 ampar vary <iaan 
•nn mount pnypurpnkup AAakaaftpr 
A j jn c  41J4JP Wail ar cat! U lO U l 
1979 tsatidty Pamou r 99 ip tf a«a»y 
aetras 1971 taUrna»nnpi TraveiaM 
bp4h aaiafianf canditian Paadylobo 
3710 Humbie

MokbrnAcctaioriM
N f tar van bucket laats I99aach rap 
tpm schpifs t iM p p ir  Good tPipctsM
Mpp^h 444 4364. ___________
FOuP new J7| I9t6fes Fp«r near ntw 
6P 74I9  tirtS  Gd4 I I  oxhlte ldf9of 
MP7| 19 tifdO Four ntw  L7I I I  w hitt 
la fttr  Frivataparty 494 4414

tp c ftm o w n
FOP sa lt 9T trad# 317 Cdft T ru p ir  
AAark 111. 4 mch barrai and 17 taupa 

(9‘4 ttr_ * t?
lAVAG b maddf 3M 771 caiibar 4 
months aid tPeavar mtunf and rinps 
ifviudpd 194 497 144? a fttr  I  FM and
weeke^ ______
MEN 1 Kpfiach Ski bdpfs W m tiium  
Ilka new IM  M l 749? tf te r  4 
weekdays

44 AM iqHW tArl

AirpUnts

A M A TEU R S
teach amateurs to be amateurs Oont 
let this happen fp ypu* Hanks Hite 
Center «s a Frpfassiena» srhaai Ouait 
ty F light Traminp and Ground IcbPPi 
far pH ratings CaH Hank s today and 
start your flight framing and arvall m 
th t January I974 Ground Whooi 
Hanks Flight Cdhtar, 94ni97

(AVIATION SERVICES
1* hour *v*H**Mlty IA 6 A t  F *h 
liatd Ganarai maintfoanc* Aiuwat 
and 1*6 hour i<n«*(tt*h« Maiar 
ovorhduH avianK >mt*<i*ti*N nr 
cra tt ytrippm t *nd * * '« *« *  CaH ut 
t* r  lnt*rffi*tia'<a*td rym nim

CRANE AVIATION
CrMtCantilyAirptrl m S lW lN I

J - BoitsiAMors
w it c h  Hou«« «r<th a$ harwpow** 
Marcary cn*6*r. «**H 6 Otily iraitar

_______________
1$ f t  Ouachita kg** kaat t * n  B  h* 
jannoM  ndw Ouiy tradar. tk k a t  
*6TIM **«l*rl*m

STUTZ PICKUP 
CAMPER SHELLS
Lonpwide m stock Other sues 
available ad metal 9779 ihstafied 
A b l tops 91M Frbarpiau sheits 9449 
MHtaifed
BILLY SIMS TRAILER TOWN 

S20E 2nd OctMOd 
07 66)$

PHARR TR AILER  
Sale 8. Service

Feafuf'hp IILV E P  IT P tA K  AttO 
COACHMAN Travel Trailers and
a f o l l o  m o t o p  h o m e  1
IB TO E .S th

333 6331 
ODESSA, TX

1974 9 y Ft cabpver tamper 9944 
097 44H after ) FM 

FOP safe Open Pppd Motor homo 
Or pnd new enpint 14499 May be soon
at4349yefsaiiie i M f^and

J9/7 International '« tan craw cab 4 
speed a ir conditioned A M FM tteree 
wiPi tope dock 40paitpnausi>Myypas 
tarw w ith W > ft Vista Lma^ cabover 
'camper, prtsnmg rppm with smk ahd 
pprtappH i buiana haator etectne. 
.uantahpod autorhatK aiPctrK watpr 
Vsmsp. hpi water healer 17*993 wesFd 
COASidOf trpdd tor C<omper trailer of 
ppudivafup Cdh 644(4144

NURSES
A ID ES

N eed fo r V u lg a te  M anor 
N u r t i n g  C e n t e r  
B e a u tifu l new  hom e A p p  ’ 

| ly  a t 3800 N. M id la n d . 
iOrIvp,'

DALHART
WINDBERG

O rig in a l Oil
^'FLEETING
SPLENDOR”

Oartlew CrNi 
( I I I )  454-IOH

After 6 p j b . CaNi 
(H I)  I45-y$46 

-or orii*- 
J .C .O IIM O M
6501 E H ill Or 

No 112
Austin, Texos 78731

Ntw load yu*l ratumdd tram idll 
kuyin* tri* <Mlh vah Ml *1 ahtiguk* 
paraahatiy 'Oatactad irdki a**a6**̂  ia 
Mam* Mat* tt M a N*«td*rt n t 
kariad turmtur* OrwMal ik*m. M* 
ktrc*t*i*t&cry«i*) Fro^c* twieidre 
a art aktacii. adlhtiwt*. **« Art c«) 
tarvltidh a raatdrgtidA WMard C 
Fhiliiat Artttoua* Oftn »nrr n aa*. 
Tm  Sun 6j»id*«w $trig66* tB6
s)x aiMeu* iieht tiitura*. a ttOHm 
and > wdtl liktura* Addr*«'t"**ety ■
ta * 0 y * * r * *id  6 W n H  ^____
Foua LdW6 XV dilv* trddh llatkar 
arm chairt Tw* fait orleMdl ne*.

A
/

1’ I

I M*dh Franch carmiae% I 
cammad*. dOdTai

aM adm krdr 6 6 * * ^

■ I t
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P A o m c
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M ID U lID  M t > o m » - m X C t A l i .  U t y  O K  11,

FOB SME M  nW/IL
|o»gT-»a r—  

S«M« Owirist

i>O.Nm.UNiint

P E P P E R  T R E E  A PTS
Luxury Complex 

NOW LEASING

JTViH

F«niURl«ni 7f C i nWPIWSnOMtSIV MiC I fy lltrS a tt

>*<
I lM«IM •> '

I (Mmm *v •m a m
tm a 0 * fV 9  a i* »• m *m  «

»a<wrtfcii M
u m C*'**'*'**tswwnWtoelsnran f* r  •«
■  »*n

ta rn  <a

I*A rt 9
G IF T  SUGGESTIONS
Omm» ,mmt, 0»4amm m am 'm ^ak.rn 'P ^
•wtctM u w *  i< » u  ‘ 'a. ••m •Km mm  U tmrrawn • c»ii«<»i .mm '.icmimr.
O rm m rn m m  «in»

REDOOOR JEWELRY
7»TW IL L IttO tl

WUdUM M«4t» m a

tummumt m0

COAT OF ARMS 
ANTIQUES 

770A H tndtfM n O dew  
C «ra*r«l MM*

CMll>»tNO«l.f

; NAH«Mt 0 Ird
ir  w LtAC MM tm aq  
UHM UM»«r
«M> MM«M« f  . dKllO O •
r *  %ltm  > . t^

Im MU UH «» U N  par

^  ln» r N il« i i  GKEMBS'A^'A'
A'«9p»oIo« yo—n <y »t

CABANAS 1A2B«Aroo« STUDIOS

iR’tt) f^cptoM, ««Xcr I0 fp r  conn^icxn

MAUD NfW SaiSWNIS AT ABTMBm
3?l2M.tVAOlfV 697 3121

N

S je ^ in a
^(sgslack

l a m

K's got to be soft liviag ot o budget price. The 
"go<^ life ." Greot for people }ust moving into 
the area. Look ot the Hoystock extros...2 pools, 
S tennis courts, sounos, 3 loundronnits and 
unique Silo Clubhouse. Corpeting, dropes, ap­
pliances control air conditioning, and over-siz^ 
wa I k -in dosets. Coveniently locoted one of 
Midland's best locations, neor greot shopping. 
All oduh. So don't be ne^led by high rent. 
Come sleep in o Hoystock. 1 bedroom from S185 
and 2 bedroom from S230.

UtTS QNIT 
NlNWIMIIIEtVD. 

» -S » l

Houwt UfihimtMM 64 Homes Unfumishtd

« e s m i  « r  ph pr $

mm m * amt amm •m A® AJM
i99 Atenttw 0  N4 

M i rm00 • 
M i  0 9 0 0  W9m M 
fa n  AMM i  Alii

SUTTON PLACE 
APARTMENTS

PtAMO «WM"e •
mmrn
•A4.owiii a m *  (

MfOca

501Sch arb au e r *6 
682 3915

NkltT W9

\ 'i*S Wo oF^

'• C  A «(

r ?  mojim'
VINTuNAm cmNC iWrOM ; 
M  IM  C it iM rl «i« t|«
AfWKM WMWI WMM» « «

t lW a rM M r  Ml ^

21 W A D L E Y  
A P T S .

%pmmi% 7 A 1 «*ud«
■rtmamt «•!*> (

drr«r tmamimm itm* tv
«>4 7M4

Hm t i iiftAinifiM

BAANOOciN OrMr • •
craftad iBr fM
lar CNriiiwsM # »4 i« i

PET PALACE 694 1435

: ’ o * *M ie rn o 9 0 t» n i
•alcmmm
mm crmr cmmmma* 

mmmmrmtrrni

M <d k iH «t WeOtev
[•weernoMOi

\ l r p 0 t<»t t itm
CewurwtSMeRM

dOd tmt •mm (

gm  m *  mm
JtK _______
kddOlOiKMl

• i n  I
»Mn tra m  I Pm*a%

»miamm  Sd« Ud*

PNf BM P9C«9 i 
CaN«M IBi

um  • 1

;ie
PiNtWOOO «W M«i M  • CN^ !«■ 
PiatWOOD IV MW M il ^  \*_s 
M M  raM M fio i M P W iiiM e e i | a i

• P«i
OMctl

4MBUAM 9Ct

aaywwm•• w m • w *
if  ........M>Mw
AO«TA*i.t ffawriwr M -»• tV  IE  ■" 
Mif» fNiitRai feeVlHi 
M  CViMiiri M9 t̂n |«M ««

' AMI
•• M M  A M  
«o i M V lB

F O R  L E A S E
’  E «dc«/»ivd J » to rr  ho«nd h>f 

m « l liviAQ lo rm d l dmtng 
W d  f«e«n 3 BP 1 bath 
H A R V E Y  L A N G S T O N
r e a l t o r s

682-949S

TOWNHOUSE DUO
O nly one le tti E n try  courtyard, private patio, 
lib ra ry  studio loft or 3rd  bedroom, fireplace, sunken 
liv in g  room, cathedral ceiling, kitchen appliances, 
w asher & d ryer connections, sunken bath 6, separate 
pow der room
682 7377

66 Bedrooms 4
LABGf m<a4v ivTfwihyd badrooM m «
ham* Raavlilwi baihraam *riv*w an 
rranc* efMWman amy ta* <l4l
ONE Mdroam bam with cover**
partiiAg 
#dl 9«9

All bilH 900 tiS 999 myatk

67 Mobile Homes lor Rent

B E A U T I F U L  
D U P L E X  I

---------.r-. 13 bedroom . ?v, bath.

T O W N H O U S E

wM ve a»M«9y a v M  .w a lk  in closets IMO teet
t,m*mmmm •m m m ; UH w ju v a b t e  A ll electric S450

p e r  m o n t h  M 3  7751, ex  
. t e n s i o n  373 694 $911 a lt e r

ttA T k fd  - - —
M 3  31 )4  o r  697 S4SI

*«|  I M W  n \mmm>mmmw*rn rm o
ami§mtrf>m<î m m an
•pm mtmmmmirnmm >»i w  )MM m mmmi (m •
•mm at *m>

mmirnm OmAdd Of M
ir« i'VRMM in  lU i
TWO mtrmm  ft fr^ rV  
AAsriteMe*# Am mmm 0k 
•ipavt 04  AIM m  M

N iV  »9«aa*Mf ( iw tif 
iB i i i j i i i  O t t |  CAil tB4 AJARiNv <
9 9 0  0 0  0 0  00 40  f04  iW •#¥•*!♦

I NiV 9090 0f rmm tiM
04 40\

90 0  0&0 0400094 9004 }}
I Mi . m 0m m  IM M  (4irair« AM View (94T 
tlMjP»#A4 4#A9 094 44p4%tf At9AI 0  04 9W

 ̂T n a t f  «iMr«9M» Neww Mr rvM eTTI 
» ’A

~ ■' 904  404 I iHrUM I
p^atBiAHfO 0 0  0 *^^ %*ya i ^  ' ••eefavaiv i«w r«
« il M il A M iMfi iB} 1MI

m 04>9f
904 AIM

%m f0  0 0 0  m  40

HtMnUPfWdWM'*
TMdl l  Wd>«M> w » l
lafom  attm*
dOd r«at I m m  M«M ot«

H dM fSfvm . Unfum

PON 904 mu00 rmm4 1 bedreem 
•wTMSheB Mwcidv«r< CH iB3 MM 

AN cemM^iBirTbiigriim ivt WUMN A m«Mt 0 0  0 0»004 Ni 
AmaideM ar»«MtfWf v  pan awMftwcai 
arw aaaaArf UH wamt Mrf»»hia 
AvittaaMTBra il2 iU A

a  Mobil# Home Space tor Rant
LAdOf mm>w Mm* Nr rtnl
MI*Nr tvrmVN* lr*«d MwN* C«U
a t  lit*

AusintM Propcrtf
O ffict W KthouM  for Rtnl

4 994 90404 00 aHici taaci Aacaaa
404 Acfati tramyaar taaia witti 

MiiMaHalai CaHC W CNancaiMr jr 
fgr fyrtti^ PHa**A ABI MM _
TWO M Mai ■ H faw malal Waa 
aatMwMi *w 904 at sheas ar
wafahawsas sAa *7li viB ? 1177 
AltPONT Ptaii Naw cammarckii 
iwaca cawvaaiawi Mr camMrwaf 
040490 0 0  oatsii aHtcas LacaMi
0  TarmiAal Par laasirtf a«Mrmatiaa 
call (AM) m  #117
NfW carvwfiaroai 0  9044 saact 
Me sMd ea MarM BdfSariea Pv Mas 
^•wAarmaiiaa caN iii$i W JU 7_

O F F IC E  SPACE
F O R  R E N T

f*»«r*m«« IdMf dNTN* a t  1
m am * |dodr«M  f « «  «m * <•««•>

4161 A n d rrM  Higdwdv dcrow 
tram  WntwOM TM Attr And n t i t  
W dO drlm fon INO a tnentti *11 
u tili l iM  pdM. r«friMtd*dd Mr 
•nd Cdrpdtdd pNMy et pArktnt 
ardd CdHt«7 4 lt l

682 8321
SusinmProptrty- 

Offkt atrthouie for Rtnt

FINANCING IS NOW AVAILABLE FOR 
USED MOBILE HOMES. A-1 MOBILE 
HOMES HAS A NEW LINE OF LONG TERM 

, FINANCING FOR USED HOMES. IF YOU ARE 
I'thlNKTNG OF BUYING OR SELLING A 

USED HOME? CONTACT TIM HANKINS AT 
A-1 MOBILE HOMES FOR COMPLETE 
FINANCING DETAILS.

iLttZJUUUkOW-0000 563-0543

Susinett Proptrty 
Office Warttwutc for Rtnt

TWO room oNica tu iia  naar waAttrn 
StaM Bank Mr ram 0  laasa Call 
KoaAa B HausaBaaiMrs aS4 #134
OP PICE saaca Mr rtat SuiQla 0  
aiNM Ofia OMck from MMla«M Na 
tMAal Bank Towtr Calls#?MW
LABGE ramodalad barracks Mr laasa 
as waraftauAt Can ai4S552 Monday 
through Priday or i#4 5770 rnghts 0 
twaakands
OP P ICE laaca Mr rant AH Mils aaid 
lit# WtAMndvstriai Ca4ii#3130i

OFFICE SPACE 
FOR LEASE

At 619 W. TUAS 
6, 4 A I roam  td it t i

m  SS.S0.
At n i s  ANOlfWS NWT. 

1.0S0 t « .  H .
Call 6A I-S307

ar6ll-0123dlttr6.

71 Hunting, FiWing Lttsts
M E d  MnIM  ky dkv Ckll rn »n .
(oamocuYTyita

MIDUW MOBIU HOMES
m *  ,  

mum  I
tW UR I  X,| 
u m  ”  U

■mSMBJ
m a r l
emm

■sr

“ CHRISTMAS GREETINGS”
W H i i  p i r f h M e  e f  e  1 9 7 1  A A o h f l e  H o m e  

y e e  w B  r e c e i v e  a  N e w  Wmkpr t  D r y e r l

OFFER EXPIRES DECEMBER 25,1 9 7 7
9to7:30MONDAY-FIIDAY 

fteSSAYUlDAY 
l i e  6 SUNDAY

iM-SeZ7 MOUND MOtNI NOMB 697 1166
4 6 M N .R A U  UNHAND, TUAS

SH O P  OR  
S TO R E

f.fOO td It 14 tool mtidd «y«llt 1 
ovdrltddd doory t otlkn dor

1501 W . Industria l
Ralph Holder, 683 3210

POP Mast 5 ream haasa m th 1 m h  m 
cam m aroai tana 4BS Wasi OakVa 
a t l  157s

W E S T  W A L L  ST. 
C O M M E R C IA L

S d fv k t  f tk lio n  bv lM m g on cor 
ndr KM C em m dre id I buiW ine 
n k i l  door E ic d t ld n t lo r  r» t« il o r 
o t ik d  O w n tr  w il l  C drry  n o t*  
w itn  dpprovdd  c r * d i l  IJtOOe 
C a ll N o w '
Jean F a rris , associate 
Century 71 La Casa Realtors 

694 5911 or office 683 
6336

DEER
PROCESSING
WALLACE GROCERY 

1700CLOVERDALE ROAD 
682-2754

77 Oil A Land Leatet
W t Bwv areaMCing rayaitias 
m intrals evarridas AAartIn 
WiMtamt and iuOtan 4ll Pirst Na 
tMnal Bank BviMtng s#2 57li

Motnlf Homes for SBit
DOUBLE «r«at 3 pMS V. MHy Mr 
mshad m asifwtt sMing shmaM reef 
im id a e m  t i l l  a month CaU Patsy 
Ml#aa#
I4v71 1 a4«M 1 imad hama aNcaiiant 
candifian Msr aa«m paymtnt law

___
AAOBIl E hama moving Local ar long 
OtAtanca BMckmg yrWMtkmg ana an 
Char mg a i  7i$i ___

MARY ANN CARR 
REALTORS 

2 mobile homes 
See our Big Ad

USED HOMES
14x60 M A Z  

3 alM 1,. SSOSO 
14x10 in U E T  

3 p lw 2 ,M A M  O F in  
UiTOCOMMODORI 

3 p lM } ,  MAKE O i m  
I4 i7 0  WATSIOI 
3 pldt 3, SAISO

l4 i7 0 S U M n Z I  
3 piM I , S7990 

14x64 OARCRIST 
1HMI.N9I0 
14x70 w ia n

3dlM3,MAnOFFn
m i MOMFIKNiT
tetNWMMMtllMl

lATf Town ana Caentry w ftk 
ratrigaraMO a«r hat saaiunctA m ira 
M et ifMt Make oHtr Sat at A I Me 
411# w  W atiarcahM l#A4l

I Bag an w i 40
9 9 mm<9MPmw ti9B^

«tW 944% # 0 0  009 || awra ( 0  I
#B1|IM I

i lAJ MS

A Q U A R IU M S

£
CHRISTMAS GIFTSELEgTORr'ti
m ^ B w w w w w w w w w w v w w w iV iv W frw w w v w v w  v vwv u NNVwv vweB v vweB»we»u  v e w i^

N^k IiNim m
I .M I

w  I V  4444
"O v a ry  O w - r  C urat Pmye*

WlTM| I  creait aav transMr Me ana

14 widt t#74 maWia hama Ml^T^__
NICE 14 wMa maa*M hama PaiiyMr 
Mehta with gMi credit ena UM dawn 
aAdstma Mw paymants 5Al##7t

D O U B L E  W I D E  
1974 F U Q U A

•0 Houses for S«lt

D E L L W O O D  
A R ^ Aysakt a noma mYau can makt a homa in this 1 

badr00m IW bath with dan i  1 c v  
carpon TakaaioakMday'

HASHA REALTORS
682-6264

Vtry nk# J Br . 1 both, prdtiy 
carpol oaraga t  lancaO yard 
Total prkaS}S.000 00 
DRIGGERS AGENCY 

682 9786
Doris P inard, 683 7196 
A. G. Rogers 694 4940 

or come by 1300 W Front Streel 
rd~ ) mmHit vn I'y kaiti

w ao* IWK**
and *  carfwr LkWiy nn |dk«rtiM f  
fa r  * a d in 'i '" i" *  Ik M * a<* Harm  
d * a iE t i* « * l  M l <*>7* r n w w a i 
HOCLT. i  k id r» iw . I mm  WHi cm  
»td*r VA kr FMA Ham* t  Haww
dtanora ttc fax___________
iddAtCddV.ikkdrtam laalk Will 
emuaw VA ar dMA hiww A Haww 
■ranort «*4 MW

B Y  O W N E R
S1.I00 b e lo w  APPRAISAL 
3 bedroom . 1 bath, 1 ca r 
garage . New carpet A in 
te r io r  pa in t

4718CROCKETT 
697 1668

" W R A P  IT U P "

<m lam m
P O R T A B L E  |r r . iT c rL .- ;u = : ‘— \ ±  

B U IL D IN G  SALE , PETS GALORE
684 73^4 Idr*

Geraee Safes 41 944044k0004L I J l Miscellaneovs 47 Household Goods ‘ 9 Gift Stitc tor

Spocial Dracowwt"
Ommatm it m waiM wry WM 
lUdrf wwatoty ■  m Mwa a M  
■atl StaatonwMO traooatwory

563 2664

3629
IM P E R IA L

> tt vmgsoM 0  $90%0m * 10 0 40 0

BA( e 00m 904 f«9
Beiiaingi P rv  aar<
Marya M lif i’

f  M

letf I 90m pat tar C

DECEMBER s a l e  m iamtttx tmmm ,m»^mi
_ (aa ve  aba WM

i^ S T T J irC rs rrs L ir*
C E N T E X

s%
09  nH »«<a*Mnl canda<«n OydiMi 

4 9P0 4 I barehse gtew msttf Mre C 
rMittmae gPH B OOiWart

mmrn ^  I elan aaM areaenmg 10 m mmmm

OABAGf SOM MM? 0  ■ » / |4«rt 
PrMoy Mg tgih 0 0  tahPdai m? itw 
0 0 m t  M I  B4h«e sags a l aaMna 
fwOlMnshag<arp«r urntmtaneems 
% Pamiip garaw sa*a M3 rsmMaag

aaiw tM eaeaw ( 0  p̂ MM 
P fa *w ^e B  WWWae «v m i

994
I BIO SOM cMPhm It *a mnsas #7̂  I W«Mrm% fiawa Chr«wmas aatva

563 0072 * •  < Cam* ta  taamama i
S ti>» la i i  *»aawa

A ^  '  'mot'm «■* aaaawt- aw»mimwnma »»cw«wo»a**?
agoM w w nM tO tm vaw m w  r** % m m m ^ ' a  m  a t ’ ■ ttm

KMOAMW *waw ai gm im m tia  P E T
{PcamprabMr CWiaMwl Wtwa
C taax wramt Mr ww am pamal S IT T IN G ?
90 9100 eat M 9400r04 e^^
fP  H *  • t.am » a«m  pat a* t a r n  4  lat wa

S P E C IA L  
CONST. EQUIP

2300SIN C LAIR  
Som ething F or Everyona 

96
Ctiriatfnet Pawa twnwti^a par 
tao ia dikAwatkar PKtwraa 
itwawa e e  p«n tanp praaaaa 

•eatara paad ciatnaa (iwop 
•a n o p a t w n x a ro  paapeano.

aH Caa* kwaaa* * i 
SMi tractw wta aww

iraaMpaa oPMf aarvoa woaaC 
:P C T t C P v < t  fp a n p t G A R A G E  S A L E

_____________Q u a lity
p  Pel w wplAreeeer t  m tm Pam m  B iC ltO n  F r i W  C h O m p iO n
sprwpNaia w«» *mw tarn  M t lp a r o n e s . A N C  r o g is fo r e d

m e l «  l tom ole Pet &A C I wm caa 4 «o* mm mm* • i 
Waai M brao <«• 4 »w a  waiwow 1 **O W  OMOllty
i f  ■■wind oraa UK* tfw a  aMw«a|O ia S3M
4a<kA0a Of Ca Oaakr • «  ■  aw

4 month*

682 29B8

Retrigprplor dishwashor 3 
bkycles tovturmtwra 7tots 
ot twm mottrtMes A box spr 
ingt Sotvrdoy ortty Begmt 
ot# AM

2 X 8  S H A N D O N
aacvitic 940 MOM «m#ii aa

B E A U T I F U L
W A S H I N G T O N  C H R IS T M A S  

T R E E S
Cama anopat am wAiia ttwv la«l'

SSandua tiacaliom
C O R N ER  OF WALL 4  ANDREW S HWY.

J O H N 'S  
S W A P  SHOP

MOOBi n i  bOi fempwMr ITH Mam 
9404 0 0 4 0 4 0 9  119 n  mch <aMr 
9v tw# a#4 law
900 0 0  Pa

79#

Mega iataciMh e9 hmmahatd and 
mrecarianaevt mcrchandiM Bar 4 
Meet taa SI « mg itte bedreem 400  
i m  Bap? ead tl7 m  SMragt 
cabman u iW e a  Cdechy 127 9 «p

v f  4a and c Mar am a MM la v ib M  
9  aarcam iMraaae aa««a% cabm%

Praa aaT'sMry
M3 Mi7

Tar an

mgmarhma W tB a r SahandTrada
HANCOCK'S 

S E C O N D H AN O S TO R E 
31s E W a ll U 7 U 3 I
s iN O ta  w

N ew  C hris tm ps ligh ts  ef a 
b a rg a in  canopy bod. new 
bunk beds new shoes St ts  a 
p a ir ,  rcc lin e r. po ttery , book 
she lves secre taries desk, 
new and used couches A 
ch a irs , swag lam ps, gas A 
e le c tr ic  ranges, bar stools 
and hom e e n te rta in m e n t 
cen te rs  We buy used fu r 
n itu re
1211 Rankin 683 7872

OOu Al E m o  m attrm  4  ip r 
Mpa S4S TWM* M O  matteryat 
4  ipriwot S »  Frames l«r eacti 
tie
OadMcmf machine SSI Catwm 
pian in h  laceter US

684 8968

ng mbehmy fvtv 
0 0  90090  Dm * a

m «t«  VdciRwm < n anar Bam fv*m ah 
•hackM ann and m vca iM nt candt
9«dh BaVarMr •dltl|7

A P P L I A N C E S  
F O R  S A L E

GOOD SELECTION 
Diamond dinner rings 
Diamond pendents A 
Diamond tarring studs

W illiam s 
Jew elry 6  G ifts 

3314 w. Illinois 
694 7127 

CARMEN'S 
MEXICAN IMPORTS

Over Maanemtleclt

MiST Lew aawn yiw mwiwiaw» cla* 
Me caai SI* as wamaiy eymi w 
clven  F I aaeim Lacei*einCr««e 

■a tcaaai Onirvt ueefnaeiee 
CemeWely Ml ue raeey la mane wle 
CallT C TUtatfALTOeS 07 m t

tor Chrisimas A live happily ever 
after in this 1 bdrm brkk nke 
paneted den bvlll in range 4 
dishwasher Carpeted 4  draped 
To tee call h E l EN m a s o n  
Astoc V  HASHA PEALTOPS. 
a t ltM t  Evenmoa. aft 0147
Ty*o

Can t o  i*H

bT o w n e r

By

1 pM l }  M ty  Mmuhed diwaiad <4 
Ing  w ifh  b aa m t B ta « ti< v iiy

L0m 4040 0404094 t m  a 
marwh CahMl t a *  ^
la«M I b M t l  w eedbwm m gifra iSK  
bbm«n Mb Mw dd«m baymarn mih

CaM Ttm
Ml#449_________ __ ________

I '» MMy Mr

W alk to  Em erson, Goddard 
9 years  old. 3 I >*. new paper, 
re fr ig e ra te d  a ir . laM  sq ft 
U pper aO't

684-7726

MTMd trgm iMa«<d DaevaM yggr 
hdwM «artfh tha man? 4$m% i m "  gla 
bM«t 00 9 m  pM i tM radi taw mg 
mbchmdi L«na4cM9hmg mantMng
•MdvttPtm a* t its
SEEING IS BELIEVING 
l a y  AWAYS&TERMS

a#ii Him m____ .

O O U iL f «Ma 1 
highad m aiam n vdmg ihmgM 900 
t i l l #  40mm t i l l  a rngnm Cdh Pany
M l ##4B___________ ______
IMa# trgnt kdehan MH? Fwmshad 
Fraa 90  49 and baHyari Ld«r ddwn
yaymant SH7 CaMSiJ##M_________
FOB MM I4v7# Lancar mabdahamy i  
badrdam i  mm  bamg Miiy ct
Cah_ii#yjn w _________
fa n  009004  m abiit kamy ia>7# 1

P L E A S E  C A L L
B A S IN

R E A L  E S T A T E
F or Rura l Properties

682-6332

iV K f BOX IBIWMcfMni SMryy 
Sdbnd Mavy i# aim  havy 1 $ wbabi 
Abbva ary vcaiMni Chnahnyt &m% 
Mr 9hy whan lamity Ptayar Ptana 

0940904 040 Amar<an rtca*Mm

Minrh tmeki
•BWing B 0 0  gaabanarba Mm 
MM mbaibad Mr M M  Ldbabi 
Plan «T9h rgMMg M«n 9  M
00009% m 0009 WW0% m  m C9mm . ^ ___ _____  ______
PMihi 1040% M40mm irm% j bS^TmS  alb b5» f •!

SMi a t i r r
f  arg empad hM i

14}ana rhurg bar 000%
tanem eM iaHy^^n __
^ b A O f  gaM SaMTdai Dm il Vor 
bay Oacambar H 4yji a «  P«ana

•AiiTCO aMd n  Pvma Mr bay t
(09909400 0904094 AMd «bVM MM M
bay vMd H 900m  imck magnym 
t a i ^  SMi
COOObay Mr Chrrgtmai BaytMcy 
CM CahaiMr 6 04  i lb

vargefy M ipaad bvycM 
•49b 9000 and a9wr 09.0 0 0 0 % f t  
(y66«m canarimn MS it? m4 
M CObO pMvar mm graai 0004 
40004m f *40909 m4m anachmanM 
00*90040 4440 Mr at Phena «#: 966 
BAP baam gaai labM mm «

4610 3Sth Street 
Lubbock Texas

Call anytim e
C A tetT  gne aee m * new aiMA 
aerttan 1 largv reemg ana hah caMry 
graph Itargaraamg ibamg bMa hh 
S*#er S l l# ^  fdam Ml S#9 
BBALiSTit I Mack taaa aMyar f t  
cahant cM i9«n  PaaganabM Cah
M4 IHl

A F R IC A N  V IO LETS

F re e M i le t ia«i

43S0 feet of 7H inch E U E I .  
rd . JSS tested and dr»fipd i J * * ?*  
tubing. St 6$ todt M MIfaet 
7H mch E U E • r« 7SS , .w* m  
letted and drifted tubmgitwcarw
S160 lopt 6 m  Ippt af r*a -------
•tructurpi pipe 4ic taat Cph S -------
h ? . 79? l9r p t te r  S J « 6391 ! t* - * * -

............... m>07

tcw e,c-a>At e\,ew>es a* 

i f m e r - N ' i

toys Mr MM Smtagra Mr 00044 M a 
yaarg SaMrbdy aniy M M I •#*
Sfanaimd

» 00 $904 04400 
dMdan

POb MM «# 
tubing Sid#

F a c to r y  m a d e  m  field  bad 
w in ch  and  potds fdr I tm  
tru ck .

•000 K> ca p a c ity  etacirit
yyinch

3000 gpH on w ptar tana mUm 
tp r a y  bar •mpta ax le pale 
tra ile r  dual adigatt far I Ian 
tru ck

3 I ton  tru cks with
v a r io u t b e d t  ,

4 la rg e  b o o m a r s lo r  ' i  m e* 
C h a m

S ta rler  lo r  A iax tngint
tS H P  A dodh aseun tt

004m  and maM aarw  aM4«B» V 0  m 99094^ 7 9  (0000440000
FU9li'6HEDAFA8Ti£l(TS

OAkAOC lew Tv wemw arver 
>«c aeck rare H k i •«<ww>f 

V*«vree* ana Ivweei 
CABAOt «ew Se>wee*IH* ceei« 
aee laeiem  <*ee <w •«» Tv 
iiewwt mncHiemew Pai mieiew 
etifSH
miOviNO MW FTWer mm Se»weev 
NWa t^ S  Lcre-w 
CAaeoeT MW O ff kveneew vmw 
eer aeeSeneei NT'"* Cwteet tert

STATf IWSetCTtO
s t a r t e r  P l a n t s  isc t io o
BLOOMING PLANTS I I  » u p  

MOIST RITE PLANTERS 
9 lo  $ Saturday Only

3114 W . M IC H IG A N
aae Rcee< mm ttm* «-e> at 
ceMetws latf
n*MM*W aW e«iaaw levnew f t  
cetiewl preaeet (rt^*n i** MM 
eevNC wrcee #■* m am  MMM 
a T u K **eiare e e r K k i *

DvNAAM) FeataeK laaw !•<*«•»•
caMiTi^tJM M> I7P___ _______
Heice Seen them MW iiaeiww tiTt 
LkOT*ey>. IN Ta*ker IH Ml tm  
Singer Touch 4  Sew Winds bob 
bin In machine push bwTTen 
decorative stitches built in bvT 
lonhoie on wainvT console Like 
new OMytlTS
Sowing Machine Supply 

2314 W Ohio 
683 8088

Ham Whifibabi aartabM diiTMu mrr 
SIM 1 bmP m yyhfrtdbdi diMnaihyr 
SIM I avbcabigraanMh«ripabidryyr 
SllS I avtamytic MMrMaai 440099 
sag I 44000 0449404 rytrigtraMr SM 
I MhgtiaaMcirn m m  i ts #B4 MI7 
STEPfO canMM Mr' M«a Tygy 940999 09990 ra#M nth  nMOtMMv 
%00 9044 cab kat f  icrMn* («nd> 
9Mn SITS aai 4Si4 aayg. «M Mil avan
*? !•_ -___ _______ ..
AcycMWhirMbbi partibn dithraihar 
Eacafk^ candPbh S^ M1^9# 
Black vmyi Mwngt <ha<r wttk 0  
Mman AMFM gtaraa nnfh rycard 
Biayar MiMaakcabmr  i«7MU_ 
ELECTBIC iMvy and ryfrigeretar 
Mryotgy ##M|M atia'̂ ^  ̂
MOVING gaM SMvy cduck kmggtiy mattraM nnfti ba« iprmgi and frymy 
bagatar bad anm kaadbaard kmn maftrtgg «nd bai gpriagg bodighafvat T«m yaar aM Mit bMdbad fngitgh bwiMdg fraa M gbad kama
##4##S4 ___ _
POP gaM Wagfmgbewgi bwifi m aran 
SSI Call i i i n i i  ar gaa at n i l

\ 682-3259

TALL CITY APASTMEkTS
i m  G ard t* City HtgBwiv 

Al l  BILLS PAID 
tanvsssMPfrww*

Pivpt4>34yi

rpiC iO A iat wma 
mant girt gag Mmpt. 

n btamMbi gMT

L A P M  II  b l i ' n e  ■ ■ n w iw  
mm vmeer Wa a*w SITS

HMK O ta  aemet

S A T U R D A Y  6  
S U N D A Y

Calar Tv retriaerater gas 
nge dfap trmt* twm beds 
eeier. chest Much mere 

Carafe in aMey
2709 W. WASHINGTON

I eeth An*. I a m WM Ware
m a a
FOO sew fereae u e r V  vetiwm 

xwenrt w,ih anethmenrs I veet ate 
SM Ipewaevswem wie la SlMtH 
I id  n  whhe vhiWrw site If St
f*< eert

D R U M S E T

0000  vbad aMetfic sMva S9 HMaa 
may bad naabt yghbUMri SaS Can•ftar ijidi MM _ __
PAINT Makar f*va gaiMn cawiimyi \ 
94 icagagaianagaiMh i#2_79^ 
fBNiTHcaMr Tv wifkramaMcenfrei 
BaavitiaKabtnai SII# Ca iia iiii#  
KCNMObf aMctnc grarmg mackma 
949% avarythlng m maaM dagk 
cebwai SM# cash aydy Saarkt
altar I ___________
11 mch black and whiM Tv Onty 1 
mantht aid Stm wngar warfanty 
Laavmg Mwn S45 ar ba9 ittar 
a#? »M

FOB gaM Saarg kanmyra gas dryar
Call 17 la tia tM rl______

1# N ypright fraaiar S9 almaif nym 
Matpami dighwaghyr SMb Can 
U3M77aC9yr^_
A Baawtifwfcbvck gpyyn gbM yttian 
tahify and Mag carpal graan gaM 
Mtja
WOOL rugfvllfMraipatMrfi MrmKa 
Mbbad braakfygf tabM «rv9k i  chairg
i »2 i?B?______ ______________
SAVE SIS#bh Pianaar HPAA MltMray 
Mtikarg Na« m batag Craaf wand 
•f a bargam arica PaM S*9 atkmg 
S4M Aftar S p m IMS Ward i#4 aHI

9999 M e#  ^949 Wuf
mrtdiHbba fbod cgndifmn Sif#

AAAGS
Sana sleet chrome slotted dish 
u  *7 tea

C a ll 683 5779

KHWiNN M mck can van M»i bMa 
•gcaiMnt cbnbttmn SIS C f «paghar 
Mbrbg SI# Oram bbfbibyi SIS 
i l l l id i

GiftSaftetor

n  pivt ram  mm kWe maa ceraei 
CaheatHHatie' 8 and um atnet

AUTHOaiteO Lionel rae*ir Weiwn 
Wanted eM Iravn Treen ane race 
carslw MW n i MM OetsM

C H R I S T M A S
S P E C I A L ! !

Now t i l l  Dec. 24th, 
ON ALL 

HONDA LIN E 
P R O D U C T S  A N D  
M O T O R C Y C L E  
A C C E S S O R IE S .

baWbam Ibath MncaandiMrgaaar 
chag id l 4t1i atMr I  ar ib l iT ti y«i
Mr bry c t ______ ______________
IfMbanada U i i i  kawbabream t«y
bath tfcirtyd iMd dbnm aartoyHy Mr 
mihyd Sat rnttby MabpryoaM Sd##i
CaMt#? 1114________________
POP gaM Mlg Cmwnaren mabiM 

ma I4md# McaMd at NhdkrH 
Tavag Piaata ahenv sal #t$i batnaiw 
IB and 1 Mr apaamtfnynf m  migact 
Si.«B

iN T fbflT C D  M burchabng agyity 
San iacmM aryy kaytyny Adantg 
•aaitbr d#4«Mi

C U S T O M
T O W N H O U S E

MAKE AN OFFER
GPf Cartiticatag AviiUbit 
Par fhagy Nard Ta Ptyata*

G LE N N ’S
HONDA SALES 

M i l  W. W all 697 1471
F L O W E R S

& G IF T S

On lik e  new 14x70. 1975 
Cam ao. 3 bedroom. 3 baths.

>w porch, s k ir tin g  F ur 
n i th e d  o r  u n lu rn is h e d  
B e a u tifu l condition

683-7537

We are leaving Midland arxl ft 
ter this urtigue oppertvnitv ta buy 
ou r  lo v e ly , cu stom  built 
tewnhouse ispadousbedraom s 
7*^ ba th , sunken teb  7 
lircpiacts. large aen and livine 
area, beamed center pallo Lets 
ot other extras Call

697-3496
For dppOthtfTMnl Fg cbmt by 909 
999 for yourstlf Mov* up to Ivi 
urMvt tpwriFfogbf living

t#11 Naw NMbh tl«d# 1 M 
bath partially Mrntthyd 
M nct SS4I0 ib llT tS

FOP all
HOLIOAY OCCASIONS 

MASTf PCHAPCf 
BANK AMEPtCAPO

BU D D Y 'S  FLOWERS
l|»W  Wall______________ i#4 7411

fflS FMatwbdd UbM. 1 b 
Mil battn Small agyftv i
paymanH ##4 cm  tMr s 
1911 Nanr NMbh llx##. 1 I 
bafh partMiiy Mrfughyd 
Mnca SS400 idl iTfs

305 S O U T H  
D E W B E R R Y

3 bddrpom g. m  bd tti. Fvll carpat. 
frp sh  p a in t PatM . g a t g r il l  
t to rd g a in b b c h  I33.S00

C04AC and rygigtyr at Tky Chyrry Or 
chard 4 imgbrial STMpjinb CfnMr Mr 
SM gift carttficaM drawing yack 
Saturday wntil C7>rigtmag

1975 Flyytwbad 14«M. 1 b 
Mil bbfhg SmaP agaitv 4 
pdrihtnn  d#4 45S? iNar 5

I - - 697-2408
COMFLETfLV rtdecwewe irew 
FermienE flaws tiS M  «*<fxn

F L U F F & P U F F
PILLOWSERVICE

T O W I N G
S E R V I C E

It (teem Hulls, deedariies raviiaiiiet 
youraiHsws iWwHckt

P IL  O BAR 
M ajestic  Cleaners

OualPy CManmg Mr Thaw Wha Cary
615 W . W all

14 ye a rs  in  m obile  home tow 
ing  se rv ice  Complete iob 
te a r down and set up Call

Odessa, 381-4793

TOP
LOCATION

THE TREASURE SHOP 
213 N. Main

1917 WyglchytMr 14yd# 1 999rm 
9 bath campiytyly liKnighya 

wathyr dryyr SMIO dawn laky up 
paymyntg 561 d«l4. id? 1465

Houses lor Sale

Happiness is a look ot success 
with fashion appeal from Tt*e 
Treasure Shop Top brands top 
quality 4  top lashien all add up to 
a real buy

FREEGIFTWRAPPING

R E A D Y  
F O R  IM M E D IA T E

•ua*t*m o
imrtma m tfm  
aeaarliw w t *w *ew i
staswew (m e tre is '

FAINT met* won I

VARULWA bwwr aw* If spaae aw* 
tyeew 'il* ' rttare* c»rF**«* 
yethes ptw ayw c*f* MHJO tf*  
OOUdLC aee meNrew w ^ a e*  ta  
wpa ana frame e»<ew^ cenewwf 
U l Chars (WHt »l Cherue Ptrnm 
praa SM fO i sue tfewi f t *  ,sm
tm  p a lm  tm  miatye

C H I L D R E N ' S
P L A Y H O U S E

A p p ro x im ^ te lv  6’ x r

LOWtbV yMclrtc irgin Ftny ctndi 
Ndh 1175 Tanpym btcycM 19 CdK 
ptiyr «  Idl 1497

47 Household Goods

I
tiwaam cxw. M Mat caw 
Faaer 4*er AMma hRy 
Spact fray aWe cfR Ml 
f U l l f l

X ' /
•OP t o m  awra

yaar tie tXM cm M
fa* 4fks Ola t > t f »  

a
aa MWvmaw m om m a* i 
a u a tn ra t  CenfysfH

41 M iB CfB M iM
CONN 0  ttdt hbwpbbNB m0%*c msM
%m giH'gl»a«ch iCMBOTa bMa bM#
SB m t o i
REFRiCEeATOR 90009 40 dMc
trtc stave elect ana wMW TV
ipnniiM . wriFere Tanm Bfi t*a
ue* atTTJM SaWedey ettar tl Band
Sanddy

daf iv tred  and set up
697-2201, ex t. 108
oierctis ■ ■ J rr-iii'tm

FOR MW tihch a*k ttcbanei ta* 7 
plettarm rackers new Hnw 
latte Aeuarivm M>ktl> >WI 
eiiiabeth ' _
Ce claihei dryer vWiW E'cilWn' 
canenwn SM a t  ittt 
f i
:wwiiwn xf* *9t Mf*t ,  ̂ .
i iOmt piece Mile aecan m m ntfim  
wiM fw ee  MiiWh ̂ eii a t

mmtrnm  key s aw  1 tpaee fu is  
earn m txcetwwi cawman im  ft

SteeL'WO serw raiaFr *m *oP  
Reitaa iFrench Renewaem*' 
price Awe very line ,«wetry a t  U’ J

SpE XEl cabemei C hina caaihil an* 
evallabW Ftrwcl caneitwn CanTwii 
•rani naw Save SMt tram retau trice
e»«ataswta> o i i  _
t«*6 S Wavwr hard pawiae ti«* 
chew FrUHairt FrtM free hveier 
f4*Kh*sMMi XlMchelwMe aft <Mi

GIFT
IMAS

Skty BBT p i* t Bccttiaqr s t t r i  ^ 
G ifi cartiflcBtM to#!

Occupancy Wsta* has baan tr*p»r 
aainttd I ar brkk. 7 iivint aaat 
neuM IS campwwiy cam *** w 
ctudmaihtbaihsAkitchtn snackbar 
utility Me* cavar*d aalw WKte tw 
aniy s n i f f  Call  a E a b y
r e a l t o r s  
a t  nt f

a paiw
Call

a«; iia i a*< n * i

LOVELY I yea *W WtsHift «w*ti 
m* I aadroem I ». aalh r*tria*rawe 
air iiraeiac* bum mt Wry* uthrty 
raom Waeed carpawa Tea par*y* 
laryt fencaf ra *  Xrith waWr weh 
NIC* asswmplwti a t  Ml,

T R A I L E R  T O W N
SaiACT 2ND*00056,TUASm6t
•1/ W t Caa't Semice l l  - IT* Opn't 8*4 i r

ifisiuT fAsi ' iU B I CASON

F H A
a p p r a I s e d

‘ aaparfi I 
vabw I 
t dan

NIC* MvihiiPt aaparti with Hat ay 
n a  ihraM* IWa tom* 1 ta praam 
lU bafh dan larp* cavarad eah* T* 
sae ca i a ieoiE  ceowoca *s*a 
a  H4SMA realtors  w aM *
EreWms ft lT lH  ___

I I,

u
A

INVESTORS > names an west tW* 
Natd fapair iwuii 4 HauM Reantrs 
a t f t i t

3 bedroonn, large liv ing  
area. Den. Great k it 
Chen. Refrigerated air. 
M any trees, appraised 
a t 541,000. Call Jan 
K le m a n n , C a rr ia g e  
C o m p a n y  684 5881. 
E ven ing 694 328^ 

NEW  LISTINGS
EXTRA nice . SI>. wall lacaWe 

]  I car
pricadrifhc 

LOW DOWN PATMENT
4NOUSTPIAL tlacrts 
HOUSE TO RE MOVED Naed at

Joyce o r Ray Sm ith 
6«7iM 1I

Asset XonaH jamas Raaitw
■v 6wA*r EbiMty ahf tstwin* 
paynwnts Ibedraam. I >. bath Pan I 
carfdraea arks a to m _________

B Y  O W N E R  
1 60 4S H E L L

■rick i  aa praam iv, bath Nvuif
raam ammy aryt dan with cawwr 

I Eltiraelac*. wen shap i*ii ay n 
catWni cbndftWn mtid* abP tat Fra 
tassiooaily eacarawe nuny axirat
Lm*srs '

For Appointment
A

Call 4M 5611

SMAl
DOWI
J js J
RbssI

IcCcw

AND
MOI
WAC

Kia
Min
BIG!

EAST

11*

MR

LO

3bed 
w ith  
finish 

‘ large 
f t .  I 
c a r  
re frIt 
bonir 
wax ' 
andn

I



/

le H o w iN r S *

5LE FOR 
MOBILE 

yiG TERM 
; YOU ARE 
LUNG A 
^KINS AT 
OMPLETE

S63-0543

t m im nmarl
m m a

m f

K S ”
Mo i m

Dry#rl
t 5 , 1977
T

M 7-M M
O.nXAS

H o w m o fs ^ lc

.W O O D
lE A
• nom* ill t^i• } 
H Witn tftfi fc 7 car

•EALTORS
•6264
r I tMth. prttty 
I t  f«nc«d yard 
000 00
IS AGENCY 
19786
•rd, 683 7196 
ltr»69 4  4940 
OW Front Strett
»i« r iiw  I'y »•» 
■rgt ttmtm 
M*ly iw nattrtiart
It «M AM H«rrl« tts7trimim

tm. I M«i will c«i
lA MM* 4 MM*

mriim. latiw will 
IHA MM* 4 m m *

W N E R
W APPRAISAL 
1 b«tn. 1 car 

y carpet A in

lOCKETT
M668

P IT  LJP"
hllvt nappilyevdr 
bdrm brkk nice 
Built in ranee 4 

arpatad 4  drapad 
HELEN MASON 
SHA REAtTOaS. 
mp4, aa* 0}*t
lara»»*a a*n>* ty

W N E R
K io n . GocMard 
t^a, new paper, 
a ir , I4M  «q tt

•7726

S E C A L L
K S I N

E S T A T E
il Properties
!6 3 3 2

STOM
IH O U S E
ig Midland and a< 
appertunitvyaBuy 

cu ita m  Built 
pac iaut Badraam 
tunkan tuB I 
rga dan and llvine 
cantar patia Lata 

I Call

^ 3 4 9 6
iM la cama By and 
lit Meva up la lux 
*tie llvine

iO U T H
B E R R Y
*• Batk. full carpal. 
Patia. 9*1 eriii 

k %37.me

7-2408
irm m t

t  tis MO t94 4jn

O P
A T I O N
n, large liv ing  
n. Great k it 
rigerated air. 
es, appraised 
)0. Call Jan 
1 , C a rr ia g e  
y 684 5881. 
S94 3783. 
LISTINGS
e. Il>« awii lacalaa
PATMENT II car

L I Jacrai 
K  MOVED Naad al

or RaySmitti
•ST iN II
>•*< t — __

01̂  m u mi 
drmm. I >d Mfti gtn I 
ck 04mm_______

O W N E R
IS H E L L
MM IN Balk Nvina 
araa aw wik cawac 
k diaa i*» la fi E* 
w imia* add *a* Pra 
caralaa m m  aalrai

ppointnient

1684 5618

/. I S /
\ •  ̂ ' J

T H I  lO DLAND M P O f c n i - T t U G t A l l .  lA T ,  DKC IT. ITT

V /
/  <

H M M lirS d t t

k ^ )

R E A L T O R S  '
697-3123

3 3 2 4 N .  M i d k i H M L S

RISIDlflflAL
Goddard-New home by Russ M iller Buildw 

116 ke.1 living area w ith firepioca. formal 
dining, sequestarad MBR. lots o f nice 
paneling. Energy sever, dbl. insulation in
woll 8  ceiling, insulated w indows............. $74,900

kdnsos-IfR. I hvmg orea.Tiew paint inside.
:_ « w te rw e ll...................................  ........ $39,500
Country Home-2 BR, 1 living o reo .T w ote r

w ^ s  on 2 ocres............... • .  ............... $31,000
Mariono-3 BR, 1 living area, p e r f^  

condition. Almost new corpet, metol
Pprofl* ■.............' .....................................  135,000

Mobile Home-2 BR, 14x64, large kitchen 
plus fence & s k irtin g ................................. $11460

INVESTMENTS
SMALL OiriCEBUILOIN&Ukcaladdoiwtoan SlNAie
DOWNTOWN PItOPfRTYAImMtwtrabkkIi SMAW
fgtiIOeY_oMiceWdg onWollSl $ l i A «
PstiAla Off ICE BUILDING SITt with mcoma prgpartiat

ClpM to domaitoiw _ ___ ___****<??
lifcma Aoparty Raniol Homai,"Bupieikei. Tripitiat t  Ouodraplaiai

CAU

Office BviUing hr  Loose
Mia rMMdalBf 4 hmh§ 4i% W. kt̂ mt (1  Mli, IrMa lit 
Hall Baai), Variaai Nim  af aMica laRai aiaiaWa. Naa 
Kriiai. Mava N Datiwkir I.

DEVELOPMENT PROPEIH
ANDREWS HWY ^rmalocalion CAU
MIOKIEEiuttnortkotSASUSOocrai CAU
WAOlfT at "A ” STREET opproiimalaly X  84 ocrts lonod 1 raady 

for davatopinani CAU
RLWOlSAVf-comtr let nawDaaaood Shopping Cantar CAU
MIOlANOORIVEcornar lal.aicaHwt homaor dupiti Ufa S4JM 
BIG SPRING-good ratoA loootion 3 lorga loti plua 2 houtat SSRAIR 
MARIENEEL0 3krgalottpluihouu.coflvnarcMl USARR

FARMS I  RANCHES
EAST Taioi Ronch'2S oc to 900 oc troctt eyoloBla 

Baovliful icanc cauilry. itraoms aiik Boot A 
Cottidi. Lokat. Timbar, heuMt oygilaBla an 
loaw iracn Mott at ranch loan «  Coadol
Bonwudogreu  ____ _̂_______ _________ S^igSieB w oaa

FIVE ocrot, GREENWOOD School Onmct ~ $LSei
B4SfOlONRANCHSIdoodod. 33looMd UBwoaa
A.I94 ACRE RANCMCronoond Word Cowl«i SSRocona
I3.000ACRIRANCH'/onoCounty Boouituiranchhavia STSwono 
OKLAHOMAeOocroiaithuroduc*igo4aoll.aMn<rdlloyalohlo SSR.iH

B tm  RKVES.. .  697-16^$ CNRS R IIV D .. .  697-363$ 

lARRT RANKIN. .694-0160 $NBWT RANKIN . 6944560

"CAU US FOK rOUK INVtSTMBIT N flD S"

MewRpttrSeN

683-1504
W aHON TAYLOR REALTORS

" T O M  REAL fS T A T fS T O t f "
Reef Istete M ar i c t

f lS « 9 7 m »

City
R e a lto r s

'•‘ W, Urn ti. ^
'7tp

m Mm iW *

niSANDRiW S HWT.

n i l ;  A real doll! Charming and immocuiate 3 BR 
B rkk, I 3 '4  Both, I Living area Very good 
location $$$,000.00

tR C a iM T  WCOMt P tO P e n i  W Umts. mdudmg 
duplexes ond houses oil furnished and »i 
excellent condition Very clean, ttoys  rented 
yeor around Rare opportumty for investment

m n i R ^ v A f r  200' on Hwy m busyTl 2UU on 
smoll bldgs on property 
for new development

M i n i w u v i i i K L i s ;

oreo 3 
be cleared
$ss,ooo.eo

of the k n t remaining 
tracts on Antkews Htghwoy Prime locotion, 
ten acres near p ro p o t^  loop Zoned 
^ g g m g o o ^ n ^ e j i d j j t ^

C O M M naA l LOT; Comer of front i  G Smtoblc 
for various busmesses Building on bock of 
lo t m O Q Q jQ

C O M M nO A l lOTi M itb 3 BR. 
house eosily movoble

ivy both trome 
$47.500 00

FAIRGROUNDS ROAD; 3 Bedroom House on 4 lots 
$13,000.00

WE SELL FAST CALL US FOR NAPPY 
REAL EHATE TRANSCATIONS

ee7-2sei
*94*140
t*44e99

Mylvaraltt

(^aaikaa ̂ ka^ î îg

I I
*9473*8 

> t c s m i

1*1-35*4

HOMES
VELVET RIBBONS—ateald coniptatf UU pk* af thU 4-1-2 

SuparlockUoa-iariaiBiafpaalAekbaaada AuBun ICS.I** 
JOLLY OLE' ST NICK—daaaat aaa4 a chimaar la fo t Mia 

tk t i nica I  BB brick. U r(e diaiM(. 2 car f«rae» m
TtMaikMa ......................  ... $21.W

THE ELVES—could have t  workibap hara 2 BR aa gaifl 
■tract. Urea paaciad kitchca. b i( Ml aa RoaacvcH AJI.M* 

TINSEL A GARLAND-wrap ap lU i 2 BR brick. HoU>aaad
bath Good lacatiaa on R ic ..........  Al*.9*0

HOLLY 4  MISTLETOE-aauM be Mvaly M thi* 3 BR brick. 2 
bath, la rfc  oUlity roaai Claat ta achoalf 4 thoppia* oa 
Lauiaiaaa $37 9**

THE GRINCH STOLE CHRBTM AS-bul you caa makr i  liaa i 
on Ukls3 BR. 2bath. acw lift la ta a  Raoaevait CALL

SANTA AND HIS HELPERS—ara buiy compMtiae thta aaa S 
BR, 2 bath bcaaty oa SycaoMr* Quality huilt. goad dcufa

....... AS3.M9
YULE—h* glad to wrap thia praUy boma up tor ChriitMai far 

the fa n lly  Naanag coaiptcUoa 3 BR. 2 bath oa HUI Law
downpaymcBt   SU.iaO

OTHERS
Vk SECTION LAND—Great iavettmaot properly. M miaarali 

included. 3 water walla CALL
COMMERCIAL INVESTMENT-Super lacatiaa near dowa- 

tawntocaavertorbuUd InveM today tSS.OOO
CHURCH—Large coBcrete bldg Reduc^ la Make a better buy..............  Kl.MO
LAKE BEL'TON—2 Mtf near water AA.9M
LAKE LBJ—r in e t l caaatrucUon. beautiful aUe Large boat

dock. 3 BR brick ........  , tSA.99*
KINGSLAND—2A acrct. kwy froatage. stock tank Great 

Inveatment . . CALL
IS.S ACRES—la Greenwood ichool district. Owner will Mib- 

dlvldc in amalMr tracts Great for mobile bamei ar 
country living / I2(.SM

ACREAGE—Agricultural purpoaai. different ilxe pMta
.................     S3W/acre

CAN’T  PIND THE EXACT NEW HOME YOU ARE HUN­
TIN G * LET US HELP YOU* WE CAN HAVE THE HOME OP 
YOUR DREAMS BUILT ESPECIALLY POR YOU COME IN 
TODAY AND LET US SHOW YOU HOW•
C4MHTNIIOUANO..*97SIM W ..N l*TD ................*97 IN I
SNAROMwooo«ee..*«iiit* a ieu iO T B .............. *94sim
MAKAennwe ...M I-1 4 ** O IM BiW Aie............**4797S
HAtHNHlBMS----- **1 » »  MAA«IIMMBIT____ **414**

M m  TAnoi. c e i. .  u i- i*4 2

H a M N r S e l t N "n S S e M S m ie

MARY ANN

CARR

FOR FRIENDLY SERVICE

90SW.
M 5S0M I

NOU$D
NtlUptand. IBdrm. IbatM Rttrg ILivewarM 
4A cm  JBfdrbani I Bath 
219 EaW Orel* Orivt 
IMW Catt4arnm.24tdrm IBalk

LAND

Greenweed Sckael DWrkt ■  Ac r iiieed  water 
Greenwaad Sc heal DiWrict I Acre tracti 
Sautkal Ttrtninai. SAcrei eaaawatir 
l a  Acre Farm. 1/12mewrat SWalWiMtr Tei 
Canwiwrcial acriaeneaWM tuan 
Sm screaeaianAnarewittwy 
Fatreraunded t4Acrti*a«awater •utafcityiekNi 
WacraiatFt sISanAnlamaMti eiN Mn 
WlAcrei HauilanCaunly cayertdwitkkmbfr

Front StnetCeWtrMack>»iiaine  i m ia  It 
FI WsrthSt LJ4i
era Start atMmMrSNreahN MM M •• taiWmeWri

6I2-2S04

u i

I G f*y*
TraUcrSeacei

GakwiCa ranch, tpara* t.Hlacrvi 
Panuull Teiai STS acryigr ant ana

NewCuWamBintiWiJf

Foi Au reee HAi m a n  em s. CAU:
Owrhc Spraybarry
OwrtBkiaard
M W dnn

**79017
t*2-7t|9

.*17-1153

BMCwnar
J*iU**aw 
9wrw CaryM

M2 Tie*

Ca*

SSS aerma

CALL 
SM aer Ac

IM9S

*443091
4*47BS3
**7-1154

M.iaa

M.9UO

M.JOO

REALTORS

13D 7 W . W ALL683-5156
WE ARB HAPPY TO ANNOUNCE 

tka aaaaciaUaa af
PAT r o u st

witk Mary Ana Carr, Raahan. Pat la an expert 
sad experienced a  reaidenclal real rslale and 
caa kelp yaa wuk seUioe your pretenl home or 
fiadiac yaor aew oae Call her at *C1-MM ar *04- 
e o i

NEW LISTINGS
1S»S IMPERIAL Really lovely four bedroom 

heme carpeted thraueout uKludiag the kil- 
choa. two full hatha, keauUful fireplace to 
warm your taet

100 HOllTfl U a DAON Good ti\m la a well built oae 
OWMf h o lt

U14 CENTURY Brsad aew three bedroom doll 
house, m  hatha, hutlt-iaa in kitchea, wUI be 
ready la nave wlo before Chnsimaa . Open 

m e  CENTURY Refrigerated air, all eWetrir with 
EOK ratine Throe bedrooma. omt bvtn* area 
Carpet is lb, and you can be M toon loo* Open 

121* CENTURY Llvine room and den or formal dm- 
Ine. 3 bedroomi. |4* balha. refrigerated air, 
ready by Chnatmaa Open 

i m  CENTURY Total eiectnr three bcdraoin home, 
14* hatha, carpel la la and house will be haiihed 
before you know It Open

la *  CENTURY Two tar garage, three bedroomi. 
|4* baths, total ciecIrK, refrigerated air, doubir 
wiadowi tar fuel economy Open 

1001 TENNESSEE Large roomi to iprrad out in 
comfort! Throe bedrooms. <»e living ires, for­
mal duung Drive by sad thea call us to see this 
one

CAROL LANE A couatry ksvea lor s large family 
While you relai ia the den. the kids and their 
Ineads will love the gameroom Plenty of room 
for pets, horses, etc Good water, lour bedrooms 

lOM MICHIGAN Lots ol family krep your budgri 
Ughlt Take a look tl this lour bedroom, den 
borne cloee le Midlsad High* A real bargain lor 
aa murh coavtnieare . . .

MOBILE HUMES
TO RE MOVED Irom IIT E Hoar Street two 

bedraam ItTI Caveatry 12 a M 
LANCER 14 s H. three bedroems. two baths, lata of 

extras mrladrd m price, unfurnished, at 104 
Aaaeiican Street

TWO BEDROOMS. U« baths, den. utility room, len- 
ctn* la be OMved from Rl 4. IM W 

BUILDING LUTS 
1700 SPARKS. cnabaildloiaHyou 
4MW PBCAN.MsIU . ..
4>SALTA.MilM  
1211 E COWDEN
IJHE COWDEN.................
4 ltE  PINE .......
4 « E  ESTES ..........  .........
3* Mngle family lot, Klawas. SemUwle 
11 LOTS asoad omlti-family
One acre M s off E Hwy M. water guaranteed, 

ewner wUI ftnanre

UndnMawkwnet **3 04*7 JaWyutt
\Arpm« Jgnei **44535 lae Owiny
5waC Hawiani *137047 Ipnonels*
Mary Am Wi *9479*4 Rik* Parry

Kali* MKk Manowng tm*ar 
N i famt

44.100

M.MO

2I.MO

S.U00

400

1,7** ta
1,500 rt

1.000 tt

* «  I7M 
*•34*47
*9437)5

*94«ai

/ 7

V a l t e t i  ^

A

M m1400 VM
Near
DaUat
Taxas

Ml YoiRsimsrtfraiBMeBiiiE i
ThIa XM » acta aatoM >a aaagibM »tM * ■■■ Maaawr TUmboMan 
aim lad* ratraat. a Mrtbgdad lab* Eaol Iboa* §Mm  S aaewg bflM 
art awly a Mw af tha ptupattm* tomea U m iaaaaw H eBM M w lM  
auh-dlvtalaim bWa idtraalt Im c4U dw aetn

Datieat N a w a k l^ la rth tt lb a d . 3«»ba ba a ly  a iM m a agg*maaaa*aawa ] 1  
aaw carpal 4ati w h u giac*  mtaww MaMarapmg Eoaaemeaamgk 1  
Uaa j  8 *  1

~tlroaaW 5a5~
Schoali N aibd aeawAleg tide bam* geemiY heew, $ am n . e iM  Beaa. 4 bag

Wtatviavi
Addniaa * T -1  tr-fT  n a r i r t t a '  I m  n  i iM aij bami aaiM 3  ̂

had. I>* b* . 3 IhrbM acaaa IMigMii S •  p an a  waoa ;
•3*»«b . . ■ ■ j m jm

MIrhtgtB Now haaaa roady lar caip*4 ihM ri.lbad . 1^ bb IBaMgw wmdMM 
calling 6  fIropUc* Only 8 1 .M ** dawn pMwMaMM | m jm

Ohio
ntaptacaa Urge bvmg art* S ta u n d p a W m  B M dM iM gru

Michigan BaaoUful flam plaa *■ a corwar Im. 1 Mega b*Mg w waM M  a a m g  
S fltapU c* IbadL lV b* O a k y C A d a M p M a c ta e w

Michigau Naw boa** boW by Cagrt babdUM kweba* w bog laMdaw M a^lw- ' 
Ing area trttk llroplata Skog IS b *  OMy K.M 4 daamflbacbMas Cl SB

Htrlowa O vof IMPHv a* R t w b k r o b r ^ h lm w m t g fM  dm w  1 I brw raf aw 4  fwwac* BaaoMM caapal 4  BameM ObW BeB | 1 
down ptaa daring I B JB b |

Megford Naw Uritbg Aliwagy agpramM a m  bneb b M a  oMb* M 
ayarything. w.Sbagaaamx 2ba riBRytuari BrioaaawfBbri m jm

btoray Owaar mwvtwg le e a d W e  paaasaa* Ooor MMBh MB Ib od  ^  
ba. 1 Uvibg. faroMldbmag rin B  OMy fk lM  BragriWbagawmma 
S3S3*emo paymari

Big
Spring 1 bagrwama. 3H balha wrw roof * B * ^ * * * * ^

Marcedaa
Ky* appaol M ai a l  ■ has Cbawal haal 4  ari haawBM taM ri tod 
wtllpapar. Shad.lba O alyB  SM doaopBacriM M m jm

Rankin
Highway

N aw coeeU actw . riaraacaeaeaeBeawiM W y Shad tB iM iM O
lo u l  alactric wriM approowMatB latvoa

Boyd Grosl Im Bachalm m aaalyaadx haoaMri IhaBoom. IbP B  a«B  
nan carpal pari* 4  warirwoB O riyU  B i  dooaglbBttmMg

Anaila

Spraybairy
r h a u T d a a f!^ b a r  l? M r d 9 M p t a ( r ia M r M i

M talon, Tx IM ac ... .............................. ... Mu i i f c  MvC TB
PloridaSt Z a a a d U ll I M 'i i e r  weBiBahaftfbM riawriWmlMd ioM t m jm
Groaohlll Acroaga ri CroaaBe Tmraaa rimkrig ri M B

Acrotgv
le S a c v a t a / lA ia a l lk  mariWwWri^iAama W B H  M W P B B  
flnaaca CaadwalmtaMaavaa

Lata
P ullyatcim ladpaybM glria ih lT iw ataalm gr Mb t l i r i m B a t  
I m U t M  LahaW bRaayBrtigM

aad has barm bata. Imaetd 1 riBmabri af M B m d

Acrvtga

1

1 icraa aft Tbaar Road gaad ootm  a  atwa ----

♦ b u n n ie  — ^  ^
tK E N T  
I  REALTORS
^  l906NbwM

¥
¥
¥

684-636$

r K N I F F E N  REAL ESTATE
I  611-4178
■  3bdrnn, I Hbortn rtf Mr JTOeGaHCauri* 157 400 ■
"  Imgtlbdrm, I Kt*elh.woodhumei|firipl I90IW Te«ei L3I.1X) ?I 4kdmi .3bothi,tacr*a.Grmnaao4 RtAiced CAU |

I Fnrbifai*i4M.CmaiitMPmpe*lT*Ma*he«,CM!
tJ.*map 3*4-174* M am i4e3t4M  *L IMftaa **1-4g71

LOOKING IN THI 4TSt
3 1 H beautifully deco 
rated and C-l l-A N« 
Low maintenance towtv 
house front pretty fire­
place and baths formal 
dinme Curbed beds 
cement walks 4  fruit 
trees m back Twogood 
water wells So attrac 
tnre mside and out and 
pist listed*

Call Perwtv Willhife
A99«r I mwwi* Meeflen

OBI MNiNS an.
KS K m HI

CwfiiLMi t w
130* W WASHINCTON-Nodawa 
pymt lor ettarana 4 badroom. 
m  bath home PHA appraised 
P aym en tf *ppr*xim ately
tie *  ........ m.SM
ANDREirS HWY-Offlce bMf 
srHIi I oRlcet. gaod tneeatmeat 

gperty 2M1 tg ‘ft., groaaing 
approx $M0ma Next t* 2 apart- 
oamM cpoiptexct t7l.3M
9 R t  SIDE-reaidential M t  
g t e g f r o m ^ T S O U j ^ ^ X ^

I

H O M E  8. 
I N C O M E

3 bedroom, 1Ki baths, den 
w ith  beamed ceiling, 
finished in knotty pine, 

‘ large fireplace. 1979 sq. 
f t .  livab le  area. All 
c a r p e t e d  a n d  
refrigerated air coodi

SDoing. Kitchen has no 
ax vinyl floor covering 

and new GE dishwasher
r \

A 2 bedroom rental, in 
good condition. Total 
price $43,500

C E N T U R Y  21 
I LA CASA re altors  
 ̂ 683.6336

.A

S K Y L I N E
REALTORS

NEW IWint an Travis > katrvini I 
bath 1 car 9*r**> Nawte 4 Wawaa
naattors 4*t NM
NEW IIMlnt an Nahias 
bath navWv raOana Ha 
Kaaitars. aai l* K _____
NEW iwme an Loetelene IbaOraam 
1 bath. I car paraaa Hauaa 4 Havaa 
Paaltars. *tt WN_________________

B Y O W N E R  \  
3518 M IC H IG A N

Pratiaaianalty rtmaatia* aitchan ] 
larga ktdraamt. > bbitK avlra larga 
utility raam 17*11* it tcaraaram 
ttncaa back yarg OaiNHnAaraa hiw 
aoutty MualtaW apart r lata

697 4954

F O R  S A L E  
B Y  O W N E R

■rick tama 1 litratw. i tarn Hvlna 
roam. Pan with tirapiaca larga Many 
raam cavareo patia with gM erM. 1 
cargtrtga Wuaitaa IK M

4717Cuttibert ,
/  694 1327
' t

MIDUNOTnEWIST RfSIDCNTIAL

jlELNÔ ÂIÊ J
!  -UNDIt DIVILOFMINT NOW. ■ £

• CiStli M il IMNS
• 1.1 Acres t  II
• ViW Wills «ii MiW

• NfMy M lricM
• MreWNnl Pvt
• SN M istw i

Custom built 4 bedroom, 2 Vi both optlonol 
5th bedroom or hobby room, large live in den,
otrium, over size goroge and fireploce.........
......................................................$73,000

Custom built 3 bedroom, 2 */6 both, formal 
living room, lorge den with fireploce, otrium, 
formol dining room, skylight, large utility 
room and oversize goroge................$72,00C

OIM ISOirTNOn-IBOIRAliilW Y
T 0 M « m (F M E 1 2 l).% M £ E A S n i

T M K  OFUiniTlESTATB

C a T l^ 2 -1 4 6 1

gv twnar tpaciaws Ikadraam. 7Bam 
larga traas. carptrt. SB M  HM 
thrmcatan ar call att 7lat ar 4*7 it7t

1 btOraeoi I bath, l Hvlnt arm 7 
liraptacat OtuMa car faraga 7 alary 
hama Hauaa 4 Hauta naaittrs
tat ant

FO R  SA LE  
B Y  O W N E R

bHreem. HrWNMcrltrmvi tfw

8
»w<rMw MTh mmtf mvr*T •« 
tTMv WW tW9t fWWf mtnr% C«« Mr 
vppMMmwiK tPMr S tW HO __

N O D O W N ^
P A Y M E N T

fgr Vataram an this 3 hadroom.)rath ham* an ewrchin Pricad *t 
l*.lie CgM JOY CRADOOeX. 
**3 1122 *r C ^ T U R V  21. 

LhCeea Neaneka. M3 433*.

i

MOUSE Mr saM *y awnar 
witti WfkcMtvN BWrWNW 

F •  iHdphtrd m* 2WW7

BY O W N E R
ONNi «vMt»A#v AoewttwA Nf«cii heme 
Three heireetw he«h weren 
freKsty #eMMN ier«»hechm« Seeie 
■pprveieM

4 4 0 3 W I L S H I R E
orcallefterSp.m ., 

694 5841.

^ t is  T H E  SEASO N
fa b* latly 4 Aiav* M  alttwr at 
thaw brick ha iN tt, 3 badream. 
iKa an egmat lat nic* covarad 
patto4 dowW*garaga LawSJTs

OR
3iean > h om 6 urttti bwHtin op 
pliancaf utiRty raotn 4  itarapi 
twuw HiM>1t7*'t Tp  w * CPH 
HELEN MASON. A*p k  p4 
HA9HA REALTOe 
tvaiyne*. t t y s t r

*•2*3*4.

MU
WI IIIN G  PiOPLE NOME 

'«4Fee4MFeeeee«ee4F*e4F4F«e4F#e4F4F4F4Fe] 
WE ARE PtOUD TO REPRESENT LEO PROHOR 

' A TOP lUllDER NE AIMS TO PIUSE
NEWUSTINC

l -I N  TOWNHOUSE FRONT WITH DIVID ED ' 
BACKYARD fRETTY DECOR-NEW CARPET-1. 
WATER WELU AND SPRINKLER SYSTEM »M  
PKET AND PRICED IN THE M S "  *•' 

PERNCLIFP-3 BEDROOMS-ONE LIVING AREA- 
UNDER CONSTRUmON-CHOOiE YOUR DECOR •

M l)
PCRNCUFP-4 BCDROOMS-2 LIVING AREA4-UNDER 

CONSTRUCTION M*.«
PXRNCLIPP-4 BEDROOMS^NE LIVING AREA- 

UNDER CONSTRUCTION M*.«M
PtRNCLIPP-3-eEDROOMS-ONE LIVING AREA- 

CHOOKE YOUR DECOR HI.3H<
GODDARD-1 BEDROOMS-ONE LIVING AREA-READY 

FOR OCCUPANCY M7.I
GODDARD-J BEDROOMS-A BEAUTY-READY POR 

OCCUPANCY .. lAT.l

: 0 «

3 & 4 BEDROOM HOMES
VA-NO DOWN PAYMENT 

S% DOWN CONVENTIONAL FINANCM6 
LOW aOSING

SALES OFFICE oea
coaNEtorsTONysaowtnc •m iM U KCONCEPT

CONSTRUCTION COWIPANT
333-3666 O O tSA ID U G

AINSLEE-J BEDROOMS-A NICE FAMILY HOME IN 
GOOD AREA-FIREPLACE »4I 3M

BROORS-CUTE 2 BEDROOM-STORE HOUSE Sn.lH  
ACREAGE-.ON OUTSKIRTS OP BROWNWOOD- 

IRRIGATED-COASTAL BERMUDA-Ill ACRES.
glt.JH

CENTURY-ADORABLE 2 REDROOM-IN SHfP SHAPE- 
LOTS OP NEW S U M

HYDE PARK-AN O TH ER PROCTOR HOUSE-2<
r e d r o o m s -v a u l t e d  d en  CEIUNG-LOVELY

MS 3*0
INDIANA-^INVESTMENT PROPERTY-2 RENTAL 

UNITS-NEAR DOWNTOWN A2e.l
MARMON-JUSTt2}PERSQ PT OP UVABLE SPACt- 

YOU CANT REPLACE IT POR THAT-THB IS AN 
EXCELLENT BUY-4 BEDROOMS 1 RATH |7*.l 

CAPE-LOUNGE 6  HOME AT RED BLUPP LAKE ISA M* 
RIC-REALLY CUTE HOUSE INSIDE AND OUT-1' 

BEDROOM-DEN-DINING-DOSEEn’ W .l
MOBILE HOME-DOUBLE WIDE-3 BEDROOM-LIKE 

NEW-STILL UNDER w a r r a n t y  123.1
SOLOMON LANE B  SOLD SOLO
sT irrz  p l a c c - t r u l y  b e a u t i p u l  4 o r  s .

BE D R O O M -M A N Y CUSTOM PEATURES  
ENCLOSED PATIO. HEATED 4 COOLED POR• 
GAME ROOM-PORMAL DINING II2S.IM

TATTENHAM CORNER-TRI-LEVEL-SUPER CON-< 
STRUCTION-4 BEDROOMS-STUDY-SPRINKLCR 
AND SECURITY SYSTEMS . l23t.(M‘

TEXAS-INVESTM ENT PROPERTY-HOUSE AND,  
RENTAL-CLOSE TO TOWN tB.IH

Leee»4FAMMMF444MF4F¥4MMF#Meeeeee»e4MF'
,« U A * S  MOMK *94-5377 OlANt TIPTON t*43B1
rDOtFttNCll *•7-7433 OPAI OlfMf* tnrrK

fC b u is c o n *94.1)7* JOflUTHB *94-4213
CCAfUMRlkOUrrON *e*e*50 JOANNOK tl24)*25

'fk  DAne CASANR5 •940M7 ■UNMfgZNT 4S2-037*
.^F m rrw m u H m *•4-7*00 ctien FowHi M3-49M

^ G t q j s^igkt Qip
^ O U A

WITH X Ntw HOW

CLYDE wmE coî niucini
M8,900-%1,000

Office keeled eemer el KM hei S  W
a T D i w N i n  C l M i l  f

k H -s m
M2-3N1

70 RENT HOUSES
•n NNKiend ler 
9  ertch er |r

by ewner wee ffie rfllre fne iii AN feed prepertfet Me KiWMN 
rim hemet Oepwcemewi ceei t> mPHen m W e m w e l 
IKM t ; v « i  CP9 WPMM peyfnem ewner bHi cerry n  yeer 
meMfenpnee perepherweite MrieWed ONen eed^ecreefe WHiwHMerwHei M thp^ree new e heeenhv iwe

DR. A. HENRY(SARA-NEC
1*14 w . Calf epuraa be 4*4 9777

U S T  Y O U R  H O U S E  W I T H  
H O U S E  & H O U S E  R E A L T O R S

1200 " A "  Whitney (Just north of Western sfete Bank) 
MEMBER OP MULtTPLE LISTINGiSERVICE

CALL 694-8834 ANYTIME
1 i

LEOPROf
CONSTRU

We ore now Parting in e mtm <

m
ITHM
eoeef We Wwb Om

\ new homes leill range from.

*37,500 w*6
694-2284 .697-iei



1 '
J \

THX IBDUMD tC^OCmt''

NHMiVUt* •

CHARLIE
LINEBARGER

ft s-4jfAhr:(
1900lllino4S

6 8 3 - 6 3 3 1

Hm tm hrim  n H M M tvU t a

TKUCtitfl

MMIH

AM. U T , . D I C  17. I f n

4-

ivwt a HMiilrftfttt a T i e i i n i r S  |e HownUrSatt

ogOFtSS/ft

B a i g i i a

mmmHtm'
CAMIUMI

■ }  «r 4 ftr
bWlMat p M  Oi»c«

DOMUS
r hM  m *•« 
Cmrffmt aid» AnmJI 

,ftrm }tr.7ki* «MUOt

7 !•» >»i|4ou.

IM'
MHT

I toir M l

l4i,(

$r mat m rnti J *s
••rMMp.iiMi carpalm(

WOSIVUT
Irak } k, 7 kpM ka 

fior H .4 IB  4n4 mam m ft 
t i l l

STCAaOM
111 k. 7kpM. <ai vary no 

Mm ha Mpara*
(XMiia ta.'

■OOMIVUT
b. 1 k  kidi to«ri|l
tidtmm I7VC
N. UNUMi 

kiWi'M 7 k.

I77(
loosivaT

mam IMA Mac

17V
CNnoni

* 1 k  a  MMip
Cmrm m>a M$ mt

m-i:

WENT IMRES 
CAUTOOAT 

fUMMlStE
I UN

iTvA

m7|
MA777t|
•«»7M4|
«OKI7j
4*7 SMoJ 
IC7 707* 
mvt^
»«444»«2
tff »«l|
tM7J*7|
MAOnl
MMIOl

FOR SALE 
BY OWNER

4309 M onty. 3 bedroom, 
1 bath, re tr . a ir. b rick, 
m id  30'».497 3703.
CHRISTMAS TREAT

M MM Mr OiritrmM Mill* HM 
raawM Vt II ah m* ptkah mn m capnpnpi I > Atm* iiwciAmMHaa 
Nw msrmt Anrmum r*m am paia 
am —Mr —M 4— »% c—Mmat—m imhwwH mrnaamt
am  laraat atm •mcmm am a/mma

w o r d S h e m i i

6857002 1502 N BIG SPRING
mOCNTUl

OOuatA$- Tri M—I nacvli— 4 , r>a bprti
a—li*v MraupMPirl. ibiinApm Harapt, paarmai 
krlcMaa kncutMaraaNWry

$TuTt ^LACt S toOraamt. H. m IM. facallani 
Mcafian an Cal «a Me. itaaMO mmmmmg poai 
many aatra aviltma. Mipa ataram* raami Lava 
•y lanuly har—

AAilaCftoat I aamar, caaiam aw,il, 4 aadroom. 
7*̂  PaNi. pan. Uvinp raom. pminp. porpaovi 
palM araa. Paawlitui larUKapinp. tpaciai 
lippitinp Mr aapnoal

tMtAtOtl Ham 4 7 Pain. Paaulilwlly
PataraMP bam ft wiai—r m tmttat aam, pouOM 
waM MicMaal, MiiTaN livtnparaa

rcP b f COUHT i pp. IM bam an ciriPatac 
baairlilwl hamt anM many aiirai. cutloln 
mrapaa ft num almpi

AaoviDtHCf 1 ftH, IM bain. 7 car par apt. Mial 
aMcrlc, iprmklar lyiMm Irani and back. It

ti/i.a«

ttio,ago

M/.i«

atICHIOAH J ftp, t bam. rtir air, waMr uttII,
praam, Hoiiyniaod bam, naw 
ulilily raam. tualiani land

tMAOr LAHt 1 I
ranpt. aaaa *
atapmp

AfHTUCKV IPP. walar awil. larpt pama raom >n 
appilian M tarpa livmp raam and dan. nanr amyl 
MPinp. larpt raami. rtl a>r. naw carpal 

CtOAA tPPlNOi 1 ftp. Vy bam, } car par apt. 
arartihop. naw raal

MAAlfHAtLO 7 bapraam. I bam. train pa>m >n 
MPa anp awl, naw raal

KWOO%0 ftaawlilwl mowntam Ir, Mvai cnaiai wr 
rawnpap by pma Iraaa. 1 ftP. 1 balm, l/p, com 
plNaiy twrnunad

114.400

U4.M0

MW cotermiatON
•y  tappa  la M ip iM ti 

SNAP TON IP P .c a w r ly a rP a n lry .ra l a<i 
SAAKToat- 7 f tp ,  A ra n tn P ra y  . 7 — m 

fty ftftft C H ttraN Ma
A lO S f TawnhawH. 1 f tP . 7 bam . vawHad c a iiin p  
AlOSS 7 ftP ,7 b a m .M a > ,< a n  
AAOii 7 f tp .  7bam . larpa  ana rbam y a lr iu m . AAar 

K tn  liM

lyW aa C litM a iP H  
4 f tp ,  w aM r w a ll. I 'y  a e r t .

iM.000
iM.aM

CALL
CALL
call

BAmBAM LAHt 
Mytnp araa

BABBABA LAHC Panen ilyM. 7 ftP. 1C, bam. 
Mp maaMr. I nvuip araa. I'v acrai. tacaiMni 
waMr wall

MtAOOWBBOOA i ftP. 7 bam. I iivmp araa 
MrmpIPuwnp

m rU H t OB 4ftP,7bam.Mrmaldininp
ttOBTMTOWH BLACe 7 ftP, 7 bain. I livmp araa
Mrmal Pmmp
HOBTHTOWH PLACC Cawriyarp antry. va 

puaiMraP maiMr bapraam. 7 baproom. 7 bam. 
Mrmal pmmp

HOBTHTOiaH BLACf 4 ftp. lap maiiar 
bapraam. I brmparaa

HAYHBS NIW Owplaa bw'lt by J ft Pmillla ft 
Paw CanaH EacanaM aivrilmani. 1 IIP 7 
baimanaacniNM

M/.l

CALL

n m o in  io n  4 a c iu c i
IbILSNIPS PAPA TOMMianadlor PupMaai tllO.OftO
H/AOLBY S4 Sacral Mr PavaMpmani SUa.OOO
N BIO $BBIHC 7S acral rtaPr Mr Oaralopmanl

ZanaPLP SIS/.lOO
ILLIHOl$ Mwili lamily plannap d ilirw t Mr wa

pMaai PaaPy Mr PavaMpmani SA7.000
miLtHlBB BABA 71 raiiaanlial MM at Sc.SOftaacn SlA.iPO 
A to w ry  4MMaiS4Soo si«.0M

CONWinCUl-tAIMS lANCmS
H BIO SBBiHO m b ip  It rattPanca. lanad. LP 
LOT$ fanaPLP Mr PavaMpmani 
BAttCHSi avar 71 liilm p i. 10acralMAS.OObacral 
S LAtAtiA 1 acra. MTMdC 7 impravamanti 
TBAILtBBABa I  Ira iM ri. 7 a p l l . avar 70 MMC — 
M ABIgHffLO  LalfarwdO 
H tAM ftAHW Y  ISacra*. Aranlapr 
KkBYlLLl. TM Cam m arcialM lrw ilM tclwbi 
UP ACPCS lawmaaN a« MMMnd MO m cuitiva 

IMTL 40 acral ftraa*. wmpmill. lancad on 7 im m i 
OAK CPftftA CABIH CampMMly lurminad on 

aiaMrlrani Ml. baawimn twrrawnpmpw 
SMALL BUHHBU p ill Map PKlwPmp mvanMry, 

Itilw ra t ft ftttPn III, aacalMnI apBortwn<ty

CALL

1I4.<

1141

I PtftsppAi rftftc r-

Sft4-7a» SftllOM MftOHI

awaar Mi4i*i r v
Caw LPmw Oannai> aaaai !■
HprvayLAPftkMtaantri tn*Nt'

L O W  D O W N  
P A Y M E N T

Vary luca 7 >aPraam. 1 bam col 
lofta noma Oarofta carpal
lanctP  n ta i 7704 w 
Waehmftlen S4*Peema<wi<Mi .
Mp PaymanH i — r iwimaMly 
tl40parm antn  1ST PaalEiiaM 
||}> 4 I7
B R I G H T  AS HOLLY  
& T W I C E  AS NICE

mu 7 bfproam
fam ily  noma on Oaupiai Opan 
fp r yowr vlawlnp plaaiwra 
SATUIIDAV ft SUNDAY 1 4 
JvPy McClwra 4*3»4M Aiaoc 
LONE STAP PPOPtPTIES 
•07 4107

It Sftburtwn Homos

G R E E N W O O D
S C H O O L S

Oewr badrppm t iv . ba tn i 
ibwnlian h ib l. lermai OPimp 
fpom 7 llraoUcai &ood watar 
wall an S acra i

R O B E R T S  r e a l t o r s  
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F O R S A L E
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4 l /M  m lM i w a il of San AnpaM 
( Ity  Itm tta i on U S 47 abopi I 
pilM  from Twm ftuNai Paiar 
vptr SftS 7M 70S caM baianca 
pvor llvp yaan al vS No 
PaaMrt aisaa* aao7

OutotTflvmFfftpftftY

682-6264
Tltlf lo jslw

RULTOtS
LEDPY HaHay7b0rH t*< kalli *P k wan oMaUr paM aaw 
wall— bar ft aoHa aan carpal MwNaaa ST? alt
BOliTHSinR Nlca ft claaw 1 bOrm IS  ftath larga
^Uo
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PELLWnOD Nica I  bdr

WEST8IPF , 
carpal 
p a A k l a n i

St7t»
7 brn btw palm lauda ft oiP.

SllTOO
bdnn IS hatka larfa tan iPUHy

SM TOO
ftbllHb appllaacai nan

S2T 7M
rm in.JW

A ^ f - A 6 t "
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U CASA REiUTORS
MIS 1711 W. I4M4S34

NOHTH'C'BaUBar'a rmum koPM. Mwkaa Imat 
raam U foal catkaOral calliap. 1 baOr—h i 2 
katka. not kac. 7 ftrtpUcat. iaiarcoH t fool 
OiaPMtar nWrtpaol Ikat kaau ap le lit Paproat 
pp4 ntay PMCa oatrai'

LAl/RAbaadyHan'a PHiftkI. hrtek 7 baProom m 
botha. nnk a » * 2 t norkaiwp. fhtsrearani 
UckUoft

BUKCHIU. aatra claaa haoM. 7 badrooHi. Iraah 
palM and onaar nUI eooaiOar FHA or VA al 
pnea poo eai aNorP

HU m e  AM DatlnooP araa, aatra bail, ckao aod 
prrcty 7 baOraoHi. 7 bath kepw nick raf air. 
lat It r  c27 nerkihop ia hack tU for 

GHACKLASD brick WaNawla 4otl bquaa A 7 
baProoH. II, bothi panakaP PmUf. kwPl af 
dallfhUul aurprtaai Call non 

CIHVEHONtaM lutap 4 badrooH. IS bath homa 
romplataly roPacoritaP PeuMa factP firapUca 
all buUt âi la kitckan hraskftal bar raf ilr. 2 
carparafta rovartP patM, northaiPa area 

BLKASAST MirrounPaP by Mn canitnirtion. tkU 
ban I baProom in, bath, nilh ralhaPral ralllao. 
raf air raar aotry (arage ftrapiact. larfr 
maitar baProom

ASKTTAIraati and lovaly 4 baProom. IS bathi raf 
air fkrapitca 2 car garagt all buUt-ini la kH- 
ckan. ovar ISSoUvatblc ,

WINDSOK lovaly 7 brProom. 2 batki. 2 car garifa, 
raf air, fira^art, axrrilant fkiurplan. on nor- 
tkaiPa kKattoa

ANKTTA frath tnp lovaly 4 baproom homa nlth 
louchai of nallpaprr and panallnf |i, batbi 
raf air fliaplaca. 2 tar itraga rovartp patio 
bnllt'in diahnaibar ranga and ovtn and 
dltpoaal. lancad backyard 

TUNNKSSEE larga 7 bedroom. IS battii. dro, nan 
GE diahnaibar fliaplaca lanlal In back, total 
price

LEISUHEaaa rathadral rrtitag. brick cofumni in- 
iidc nraplact 7 badroomi. bathi. 2 car 
garaga. raf air kitckan nitk all bullt-ini ti- 
callant ftoorplan

THOHaS a dallgktful koma data ta Mopping. 7 
larga badroomi IM botha. formal dining. 
norkiiMp. piatty carpet Will tall FHA or V A 

LBISVKEi badroewn nHh aarellant floorplan. t>< 
batht, I car garage, raf air. cuatom cabinria. 2 
car garaga flrrplaca all far 

ELXnorthaida 4 bedroom 2 batka. formal dimog. 2 
akyitghta larga ftraplaca datachad 2 car 
garaga. all tba ratraa you capaci In a nan homa 
plua Undar conalntctioo by Jamar Davalop- 
maM Co . Ibc

KENTUCKY nill conaidar VA. ona houaa hta 2 
badrooma. aadalkarhouMhaaont boCbranlad. 
aacallam lavaNmaH

COUNTRY PROPERTY
4 ACRESnttb Ibbda of aitraa. 2 baproom cottage in 

aartUant copdluoo Larga narktknp on alab. 
matal itortga thra horaa italla. raping araoa. 
atcaUrnl nalar and a trartar lo boot 

COUNTRY BRICKi badroom nHb nan patal and 
ctrprt 4 car garaga. eorrala. fanetd 

f  It ACRESoo Rankia Higbnay. roraar lo4 faorad
commercial property

WEST HWY m PIPE YAROoaS acraa nitb offica A 
lanrc

N'K.ST WALL enmar aaMlag building — a Ml 
MalTO naar donniann

LOTS
Margaa Way, Earn Oat. Earn Ja*. Earn Lyan. 7,'aal 
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Farmsi Ranches

CANTON'S
Corptting, Flooring 

Oropdrits. C ^ n tt Tops 
440eS«cWr 494^14

LotitAcfxgt

C H R I S T M A S  
F O R E V E R

TMa S acraa al ratWnf traa cavaraU courWry w an atarnal am Mr you . 
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7 miNt M Mwn IJM Htat Dawn ana ira par. manik Call caliacl

Il o r̂ a d o  
40 Acre Traci

m mtiM aam at wbw Craak non kna 
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NdiMwi Paraai aM w Ww tan lwi 
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igl74ai«fM V

*  H O M E  IN 
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IgH an II 7 badraom. l>> a 
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Ranch Estates
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m lM i Norm of NUdlpnd on 
L am tM  Hwy . ocroai from 
Midland Country CMt 
S p in  o ffk a  on alia Opan I P M 
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F O R S A L E  
4 R e s i d e n t i a l  lo ts , 

N o r t h w e s t  
697-4141. Office 
694-8343 after 6.

•* Forms A Rsnclws
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A T  U T O P IA  
NWSAN ANTONIO

TIN bcraa a if SabiWai » k o i^  
to—. parkMWa Kwar CypraM llvrdtk 
paeon I  mMai af irrakt t  Innmt 
lakai apriaat l  wauiai MOpa iMam 
7$ 77 bunfaw bilnut faaoari J Jaaaa 
Par Ufa by CHmar at 71 m  Princ wan 
only CaMaciS C .HanWMn aias ka 
fy.iMuiMn iry< f in f |6

K ERRVILLg ROCl^ 
S P R IN G  A R E A

•.soft 4Kro«. . mmarali Im 
ftcpupmanti. S3IS acra SiSb.lOO 
ftHMi. II yPAn ifftaratf dwty 
AfiAarionFlliftbrAidfClam 
malvb iftc

(713) 634;)400

L o m a g tm  S o e m

MtRT»»m<T»ir. v t v 'r t
MIT TtADf $m

697-3358

tlSAcret CewfWy ifewper
Bcrt BWFwer wnN ItABOCf B Yeert at f 
^ BBfcafTt B*m#4t MYtfratt S ter CBV9t ômrt MYrttent CaM tBr apfiM  
m»nt 1 WO 7B7 74B 
»  atfBt H(M CBAMTtry OaBd hMMttr»B 
tjt$ per acre ewner wriM tMtance ttr B 
ybbtb at 7 percatM simBte wstamt S 

MY*t«tf«t Cati ta «»e
} m m un
9 Bcrat RHrartfBrH HB dewn maftt tiaa 74 Bar rnawm 
ctMf watvr We tarry Bur fM«a«ti M«| CBtl t«r 4«9format«on \ MB 21̂  T4B
4 f t c r t  tra c ts  in  Greenwood 
w ith  w a te r ba rn  and pens 
A l io  o ther sm a ll tradjts and 
acreage

JIMAAONTGOMERY,lAM
R lE A L T O R

697-3173
V farm wiin 

r4nck PyN
.acra Can iab

eaaiais tm im

7779 acra CaenranO baawfHwlbaoraam 4 
fwma HulTIMai wim tpai irnim tlM 
ftradinaw m i l l  
Eftaia. 0HM« Tavai 
PrintfpeMmfy
WAnt£6  by mmuMual yninyavOa 
rancnaCTiaji * waBTaM tmam  ̂
poni u ia  by awnar Ml kcm. 771 w« 
cmffvaiwn 6 awWi >kawm  am born 
ihC III* fraefar I f— pianfar and
cuffrvalar CaWIMIIM If— m____
LANO an CtfMrWial AtaO lante C k CaW fMuaaft i«avar eaaffaro tac Itlc

FOR SALE
Tkd leaetiW

PROVENIR
M ORGAN
RANCH

lag Vftfftg, New Meiiee
Tba rwKk it Mcafad an m M 
—Bftwr pavad raad. 16 wvIm 
we af SaitM fa Trail in a ifrtf. 
cb af kali nwunfaint wwodowi 
Old itraami 7W acraa mfb 
ObllinM litvor runrang pornoHy 
fbrougi itw rondi gut ona ■- 
fiva wraw •— wait md t— 
aorfb fonb wMdi oiKPa an 
mlafInM —Mr fupply 1100 
ta fi of carrah 1— homai 
Mom rmeb bawM (4700 ig ft | 
•m dangnad by ana af Naw 
Maiico'i matt ravarad v- 
datacn Al wonarol ngtti ga 
with tba loM Pnead at 
SS7S 000 OwM raounabla and 
niiit iWIa tanni availabla 

far atora inforynatwyi call-
BiN BEDFORD 

(SOS) 9 l l - t 9 t l  
• r  RebMt Dovym 
(SOS) 9U-49t6

\

lUeCanfigeGol-i
' r e a l t o r s  ’

YOU RE (UMNO TOUEE MiISLanB:—
WE DO!!

NE» USTINGS
COLLEGE—A channuu coCUga la A-1 coadiboo
Auractivabackyardnnbgaibgbt 1 /1 ..................
COUNTRY CLUB—Tha perfaci origbborbood 
ftutlt— barbagua in kitcbrn — praUy brick naU.
LoUoffbwaga Rig 2/1 ......  .....
DURANT—Sutar pcrfaci eondtb— A very warm ft 
wvitingboma Sprinkirrad yard Hfg 4/2M 
METZ—UtM. bngbl ratbadral caiUngad den 
Citra larga enuy ft utUog araa Touchaa of wsU 
poper Rfg 4/7 . .

ujee

ld.SM

M.deo

10.000
NEW CONSTRUCTION

EMERSON PL— Enargy afftricnt homa wilb 
high viuUad catling in bviog area front cour­
tyard (fuialcul da Mc. Rig 7/2M....................  M,ouo
S/ESTA—ConlaBporary dupici with vaulted 
bvugaraa Total electnc 7/2 each ude Rfg 77.60U 
SPARTAN—Beautiful QuaUty ft dacorauva 
toucbei in tbeu energy rfficieal hornet Iker- 
mopana windowi. msulatad doora. vaulted
ceilings ............. 4lLJauta45.m
ANETTA—2 beautiful floor plana available 
Sunken living area ft bay wuMlow __Ak77j)ftjy»0ft

b b o IC o ^ ^ ^BA UMANN—Tiitr coroar lot in ouirt oeigl_______
Separata dining Covered patio Good atoraga m
garaga Kfg 7/2...............................  ..............
BEDFORD—A groat family home with oew rfg. tine 
badroom ft bath srcyuaitered with iitting room.
Spnoklerad 6/7 ... ..............
BBOOKDALE—i badroomi. IM baths in exrellanl
locstioo Vsulted ceiling in den ft kitchen...............
CIMMARON—Supar Mcslion with besutilul trees. 
Light ft bright, freshly psinted Kfg. 7/lv,. Ap-
prsiscd St ........................
Efi/JC—Rnsdy for occupancy! A lovely home in 
Immsculste cooditioa Extra insulstioa Close to
grade school 4/1 Rig,.................................
FAIRFAX—A must see on s lovely euJ dc sac Some 
new carpeting Like new paneling ft cabinets Tons 
ofcMsets 4/1 Rfg
FANNIN—Cuatom buiH beauty with brick floored 
entry, kitchen ft breakfast Spnnkicred Biull-uis
everywhere Rfg 4/2.........................
GODDARD—A spacious home 10 perfect coodiUoo 
Earth tone decor formal dining A pieasurt to see
Rig 7/lH ...............
GOLF COURSE—Tht exccllcot quality ft 
meticulous planning show thru-oul this lovely 
family borne LTrculsr front drive Beautifully 
designed kitchen Rig 1/2 . ..
HUMBLE—rXavAoat to entry, bvuig ft dining 
Huge playroom a study Custom built-ins. Rig
1/JM ...............
NORTH J—Lots of charm reflected m mirrored 
walls Tract ft recessed lighting thru-out. lo mint
coadition 1/2. Rig .....................
LOUISIANA—A well msiatsioed older home. High 
ceilings. Paneled den with bookesses ft lou ai 
storage Curved front driveway 2/2ftollica. Rig 
AfAR/A.VA—Unusually lovaly home with lots o4 
built-uu Caibag to floor drapes Lots of buill-ins.
Rfg 7/1 ..................  .....................
MARMON—A fantastic floor plan with lots of spoce 
lor your family Sequestered master bedroom
Largo play room Enclosed patio. 4/1. Kfg.............
MAXWELL—Ltka new coadiuon with 4 large, 
private bedrooms UUbly large euough lor sewing 
or bobbiea Lovely decor with touches of wallpaper
Rfg IM baths ................... ..............
MISSOURI—Uarga house at a great price, t bving
areas Carpeted ft draped thru-out 1 /lS ...............
NEELY—Stipar n—rtainmrat areas inside ft out of 
this ho—y Heated pool with t dressing rooms If 
apace is whal ym need, don't miu this with den a
study a auaroom a 1 bedrooms, 1 hatha...............
OAKLAWN—A vary special home with tall rustic 
beamed cellingt (bra-out Double lireplare in large 
living area Pillerocd Meaican tile floors Evary
coarelvabte luiury i/ia .................. ..
OHIO— Lou of oew redecorating it a very Uay' 
pnre Touches of wallpaper Coavtaieot locadoo 
2/1 ., 
SEABOARD—Largr living room ft unique round 
dining room will wm your hearts Lota al “ new" has 
beeo added recetuly to make this t/lM, 2 living area 
home a dream .
SHELL—Jura imagine every kisury—then go see 
them kk Uua Warwick lovely Custom perfreu— and 
beauty that's differeM with space galore t/lM . . 
WARD—Aa unusually pretty one bviag area home 
with attractive fireplace, bookahelvea ft lots of 
glass Sprtaklered The yard w rapecially lovely 
Rfg 7/7 ...........................................

New cmstracti— Individually 
investment" ..............

I7.A20

M.tlO

4P.M0

ITg.OOO

M.7W

Great

tOUNTR Y PROPER TY
BLUEBIRD LANE—Everything you ve ever 
wantad' Lota of bullt-iaa ft aatra toucbea of luaury— 
— Sacraa S/1M
PECAN FARM—ISO braruig a IM naw trees and a 
pretty 1/1, rfg home loo'' Irngaird 71 77 acres for 
tl40.0WorlgM acres lor

LAND
GREENWOOD—VaimprovtA acreage barb wire 
fenced— 1 sides Owner guarantees water 2U acres 
available—will divide iMo two 10 acre (racta Pner
per acre ............
LAS ALAMAS tXHJNTY, COLORADO-BI acrei
Groos land ft some cedar .........
ORlHID LANE ESTATES-WM orchida — (be 
island if Hawau. Ctsae la ocean with view of 
mountains 1 acres
TEEUNGUA-Haar Big Bend — Part Latiua. 
Terlmgus ft Rm Grande 40 arrea with membership 
la hunt aluk Near Mdgr ft motel facilitiea.............

aft.oM

n.700

I.7M
74.0

12.DW

i7.aa
Patsy •

LMMt DWwai Hdm
Istionnaii GRI CvIvtrGil Km| P ig -

aB3 2207 W2-9B75 6B2 7I65 M2-7S17
lit SarM •sfty Jm

Admii Crews Nrg Kbawwi
6*7*065 69647B2 •*•4177 *9a-3on
la m Jam JaA—a tm

MmuM •amay •kkordsGBI Orsalk
6B7-2B7 6M-746I 4B2-Z7B* ••7447*

Q o m n

M E M B E P

r

a l f a l f a  f a r m  On* of 
tf>« m o lt dd iirab le  farm s in 
the productive Pecos Valley 
300 Acres lush alfa lfa land, 
irriga ted , plenty of water 
T e rr if ic  yield

lAO ACRES One hall mile 
from  Carlsbad. N M city 
lim its . Level farm  land with 
n ice home, corra ls and 
w ater Ideal for housing 
developm ent in growing 
area. Suitable tor horse 
stables and tra in ing farms 

T A L L  C I T Y  
R E A L T O R S  

497/3734

JJS Q C S E 2 2 I

m
Creak Lake caMh 7 aaoraamt ramoa«l»a ylKhan «iW< bar 

diwoahar sail! tiaak<na avao firaoiact Mncf Jaarapr ana pat*
L_ ,

lake ftrawnw—a Ham 7 kaarmei
nauaa uniity roam lait al ciaaal 
patM,port* tliwa a*<|7a»7 
MOBILE hama on cnalca let at Eo> 
imN— Camp Paauwi XiwuOam 
•17 MS Mat ar wrNa 7«U Barnora
Par—n ffaaaa >6701 ______ ___
ONE acra îoS New tavanavaH 
BulNWrip racka irr—la planiiiui 
Arkamaa laiarks 'Ranraat HSa ma
aa 7n>

thB

to  all 
o f your 

Kool 
Ista to
HOods"

BISHOP REALTORS
M3-S343 MLS 494-3431
WANDA A GlOtCI MSNOf 2303 W. L0UI9ANA

T O W N  H O U SES
To bw complwtwd at>on

1201 NfflY ■ 4hr S') ISOLD****•"* courtyard avar lifad7cw 
gvoga
1707 TBtlY - "Raody far octsBoncy ' 4 hr 3 '-7 boitn Toomhautt can- 
tap' pra*iy dwor CoN Wondo for lurthor dytoih 
TO If COatPlfTTO SOON Towrdmuiay an Mo« naar Goddwd ichaol 
TBr 7 ') both formal dmm ceuriywd pevad front for fwrtwr datoih 
CoH Wondo ftdwp 613 S367ar«94.7431 
27 5 ACUfS 2onad cammored 3 725 pOO

Fbt "SnCIU " AttpntiBB let tft (tot Fbbt Neait

190B W.WALL
T H D W S Q m a

6 B S - S a S 5

OUR NEWieST listings 
humble »1 homo with touchoa o4 wallpopar

mreuBhout Frw standing hcopface in tarpt
gome room Super location.................  S*.000

DECORATOR'S DELIGHT on Goraidioa hos 
leq mostar BR-. iltag carpat throughout, 
built ins. other txtras Sag,900

HARVARD Spacious execotivaa BR with pool. 7 
tirapiocat formal dining, antartaining ai>td
living   t'»000

DENGAR Pratty 4 1 Sertonod patio has Aatro
turt ProtossionaHandacaping ...........   SOLO

GREAT BUY on Sloray 3 I '< with den,
firaplaca. format dining, naw roof 141,500

WILSHIRE Do It youraelfers iivil lovt this 3 l>a
brick home $70,000

l a r g e  a n d  l o v e l y
POOL with woter *»atl Spacious 4 7 home on w 

Ohio with inttreom. fornml dining, corner 
fireplace In sdq den

COAM4UNITV LANE Newly redecorated 7 BR home
in exclusive neighborhood..................................

THREE FIREPLACES Elgonl 4 7 'i homo on Golf 
Coursa with beautiful Spanish tile patio, atrium, 
largo pool .

LOCKHEED Enclosod heated and air conditioned 
pool area. 4or 7 BR plus 4 piayrom. 4 baths 

SPACE AND COMFORT in this 4 BR split level 
home on over 1 acres Lots of trees and small 
b a rn ........................

WESTERN Room to odd own pool on acres with 
water well Lovely 4 BR. 7 baths 

COURTYARD ontrancA all th t extras in this 
custom built 4 BR beauty on Haynos 

FORAAAL dining New point end carpet with this 4 2
homo in suiwr location..................................

LANDSCAPING enhances this well mointaned 4 2 
on Loddy..............................................................

$190,000

tISSOOO

FOR LEASE
SUN ROOM, formal living, formal dining make 

tor gracious living in this exocutlvp. 2 story 
7 7 homo ...............  CALL

COMFORT AND CHARM
SKYLIGHT, wallpapers, biqnder cantor are some ot 

ttio extras on this lovely 7 BR homo on AAaxwtll 
GOLF COURSE Extra clean, 7 BR oHors new paint.

mini blinds, custom drop—
ZONED OFFICE Two houses on W Ohio Great 

potontia l..........
PANELED don. extra large MBR In this custom 2 2 

homo on Loddy Gr—t location Call quickly 
RARE FIND on Thornes Play party room, r t f  air,

7 B R ...............  . , ..............
ESTES Well mainloined. pretty 2 BR in quiet loca

tien .FH A orV A  ....................
IDEAL lor small lamlly. Cl—n 2 BR on W Parker 
READY for new owners. Cleon 7 BR on Comanche 

New carpet throughout

740.900

741.700

S77 TOO

S74.400

777.000

STt.OOO
S27.700

SM.700

ELEGANT NEWHOMES 
AUBURN 4 BR with study formal dining. Large 

I liv ing area with wet bar A quality built
Langston homo! ...........................SI01.000

SKYLINE Sunken living room, lorntal dining in
this spacious 4 7 by Luckia Dove S07.700

SPANISH beauty on Northiown Two story with
7 BR. F t baths »47.»0

WAVERLV 2new7BR 6 r—tbuys ndor SK.OOO

GET AWAY FROM IT ALLI 
I I  PONDS. 30 walls and a creek on this beautiful 

workingrYench at Ft Smith. Arkansas in the 
Oiorks

LAKE GRANBURV Condos and townhouses with 
lakelrontoge N—rdallas/F t Worth 

CONDOS Adioining See island Hilton on So Padre 
island

TAAAAR RON. COLORADO Year round resort livine 
north of Durango on Son Juan Natl Forest

commercial
in v e s t m e n t  potential on N MidkifI Two large 

Showrooms with 2 baths and 7 extra large 
gar apes Alto tovety 7 BR living qtrs 

PROFESSIONAL BUILDING Welt constructed. 
versatiM building wtH leceted on Andrews 
Highway near Village shopping orto 

INDOOR ARENA, born. 7 wells meke this profwrty 
great for raising horses, livestock Excoptionol 
hortte sIM on 9S acres

BUSINESS d e v e l o p e r s  Here is choice N Big 
Spring commerc iai location on 7 lots 

RESIDENTIAL lo4 In oxcelMni lacafMn in eiegaitt 
e tdtr area el city

S MAIN Residontial M4s ready ter devotofiment

la Brudm
Joyce Inckey. GRt 
lam— Barry 
laVadefowMr 
NtvoKaraon

SmiNC MIDLAND FItST
617-1427 ImMoerg 
6B23lfl 
*04-7403 
*944343 
*B3-71M 
*•440*1 
*•4-774*
*945500

WmdaCraiwa* 
Jtonma VpifiaW 
CamlM MclaugMin 
Mm tkaxMtwa- - - - B-----1-
UuButMr

**4450*
*C7-t7*«
**44110
*•7-7074
m u m
*•24034

OBI *B3«3(*
M IM M I

M L S
■ L 1 9 U IB W  am cL

M M K t

H E L D
■mOTTRlOUTMi

Ov*r 1750 S47. R on 
RoosBVBlt, spakxis cofv 
tompory d*sign, 3 
bBdrooms, muHi-battis. 
0w n*r has movBdl Cod 
nowl

WHO SAYS housing hos K  
be txponsiv*? Th* equity 
on tMs 14x60 m ^ le  
hom* is low, low paym*n- 
tsONlY $122.(X)

PROPiRTY
CONSULTANTS

563-2312

17

r Investment Property

I B
Corner lot zoned 
retail on N. Big 
Spring, the action 
street. Call Bob 
Horrison, af te r  
hours, 694-8902.

W O I T M I

F a lk rQ
•BZ2B3B SB34)2t2

MARY ANN CARR, REALTORS
1207 W. WALL 683-5156

Si05.<no

S42.500

Business Seles BusincM Property S«les

W HtOtwayaO 34ctio«aacrat<rthl300franttaa«
W lUtNOIS (etpl Mn —o  hbdkrtd Or 
W MIGHWaT*) 272 Irmt Ital in city 
WMIHOUSf 7 5flO\q,n mMdk/ff

JACK 8ISC0E, REALTOR
101 CtNtrN leildiwi | 413-4442

MfWi LN 2 «

w \

KEY cammartMl Wt Met trontege M Net 09— m An 
Orewsl Hwy Onhr 76 —rcant aamn 
WaHi»*LandCanikMi 6*7 »>7 ,, _  
COUNTY inauUftoi Aefooft. O— 
acre ana — OB CWNn Fto) Ra at 
'Ftancis marrOamt yardsi maaa. 
San. MOM ar awM'M wn xftc m 
OmtrMI Tdm KM* atTMM. C W 
ChancatMr.iir aaiNal /

C04M4C RCIAL tat lan— C I  latiwa 
MW tranllnt m mawit Oattat ana 
Trias (acre— tram hubOc 7aM9y 
eultaingt 497 Tin !•••«  ry—

4 17 acres —twaan mmMi 
OOeSM rtfM  an Magm—y M 
or—irtyfarnawauSl—at CaaCar—s 
Rtahy OOnaa. TWaTfl ar RtNOa 
Ta? aa7i

Carman'a Mexican Imports heary and varied 
Stock, very high volume on imporu. furnitnrt. 
lowing machines and repair Building ia Iratrd 

Imperial Arta and CrafU Excellent tocati— very 
good stock. businrM^Q be even better vRk 
osrer-msnager

Dry Cloaner In high traffic location AU fixtures 
Equipment includes van. units for silk. wool, 
fun. leaUter Very high groas Owner can train tiS.OOO 

Car Wash — West niir ̂  j  — ys. 40 gillOT/Biinute 
waterwell Seller »  —w osrtier

Brown CouMy working ranch. MM hcres. bousing far. /  
owaer aiad help, barne, fenced, ptentlful wiier 
Owner lan finance . CALL BILLIE '

Two itorey bulldingt — Andrawt Highway with ex­
cellent leases Both .\__ t

Quarter Mock on No Big SpMng near town, ex- 
ceOent CO—merclal lociliM 

Large shop buIMJng. two kedroom house. Rankin 
Highway, toned C-l. Prtce reduced to aeU qaick-
t o ......................  -V . . .

epTBBr Baakin Highway ft Tayiar loasd C-l Tws 
feadi«aBHhoB*emJal ' ...j. . ..

S7S.0

m.Mo

tS2.SI0

sa.sig

SM.M

V

{
tm ooo

CALL
f

trsooe 1

CALL

1140.000

1450:000

1141.575

19S.OOO

17.000 r
14 000

S
**44332

4 ana 
O—ceF*’

D ia l 6 ^ 2 6 2 2 ^ 1 individual 9— s M buy I Srapertiet Calt 49«ai9i ah

'1 ■


