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Robert Keenan Won First 
Place In Senior Calf Entries

The Sherman County 4-H Live­
stock show held at Stratford Sat­
urday attracted a large crowd and 
keen competition in the calf and 
pig classes. Robert Keenan took 
1st prizes in the junior and senior 
calf classes and won grand champ­
ion of this division of the show 
with his senior calf. Other boys’ 
calves in the junior class placed as 
follows: Leroy Morris, 2nd; Gene 
Keenan, 3rd; Vance Morris, 4th; 
Edwin Weatherford, 5th; Jimmie 
Weatherford, 6th and Leroy Mor­
ris, 7th.

In the hog division, Duane 
Schafer, Wayne Cartrite, Jimmie 
and Edwin-Weatherford carried off 
1st place honors. In the senior 
sow class, Jimmie Weatherford’s 
sow won 1st, Don Ray Knight’s 2nd 
and Gene Keenan’s 3rd. In the 
boar class, Wayne Cartrite’s Duroc 
Jersey won 1st and Grand Champ­
ion. Edwin Weatherford’s Chest­
er White 2nd, Gene Keenan’s 
Chester White 3rd. In the junior 
sow classes the boys’ gilts placed 
as follows: Duane Schafer, 1st; 
Wajme Cartrite, 2nd and 4th; Don­
ald Ellison, 3rd; Joe Bugner, 5th; 
Wayne Hamilton, 6th; Bill Malone, 
7th; Marvin Sears, 8th and James 
Stavlo, 9th. Edwin Weatherford’s 
senior sow won grand champion.

In the dairy show division, Jim­
mie Weatherford’s Jersey heifer 
won 1st place and Grand Chap- 
Ion. Edwin Weatherford’s Jersey 
cow won 1st place. Edwin also 
won the award for showmanship.

Very attractive prizes were 
awarded to the boys showing the 
livestocok by liberal donations by 
merchants, businessmen and indi­
viduals in Stratford and Texhoma.

13.75 Miles Paving 
Is Goal For 
Gruver Road

County Judge L. P. Hunter and 
County Commissioner W. T. Crab­
tree met with State Highway offi­
cials in Amarillo Tuesday in an at­
tempt to secure 13.75 miles of pav­
ing as Sherman County’s share in 
the 1947 farm-to-market paving 
project on the Stratford-Gruver 
highway.

Hansford County has a designa­
tion of 10 miles of paving on the 
road for next year on the same 
project.

It is a* ruling of the State High­
way Commission that paving of 
farm-to-market roads will be pav­
ed in segments to intersections of 
another highway As a result he 
proposed 10 mile pavement in 
Sherman County was trimmed to 8 
miles. Every effort is being made 
by the Commissioners’ Court to 
take advantage of this ruling to 
gain 13.75 miles of paving on the 
road which would stop the 1947 
paving project at the intersection 
of the Sunray-Texhoma road, a 
road junction which is highly fa­
vored by the residents of the north 
east part of the'county.

At present a grade which will be 
acceptable to the highway com­
mission Qn the Stratford-Gruver 
road has been built to the Sam 
Lasley section, and work is con­
tinuing to extend this grade to the 
Hansford County line.

Through this saving to the state 
highway department it is thought 
that the extension of the paving 
project for a distance of about 5.75 
miles over the present approved 
project will be made possible under 
the 1947 program.

Public Service Co. 
Moving To West 
Texas Office

Announcement by the Southwes­
tern Public Service is being made 
this week that the gas office will 
be moved to the old West Texas 
Utilities office, effective the first of 
October.

According to company plans, 
statements for water, light, power, 
heat, and gas services will be mail­
ed together to their customers and 
payments will be accepted at the 
office which formerly housed the 
West Texas Utilities Company.

Joe Duby, former manager of the 
Southwestern Public Service Com­
pany, is retiring to devote all of his 
time to his private business which 
he will maintain at his present lo­
cation.

Chester Guthrie, former man­
ager of the West ĴTexas Utilities 
Co., will remain in Stratford as the 
manager of the Southwestern Pub­
lic Service Company, having all 
electric, water and gas facilities un­
der his jurisdiction.

The West Texas Utilities Com­
pany properties were officially sold 
to the Sftuth'western Public Ser­
vice Co. Sept. 23. Functioning of 
the company has been gradually 
consolidated and this week the 
combined offices of the company 
will be open in the former '  West 
Texas Utility office.

Stratford Girls 4-H  
Club Selects Officers

Miss Bobby Dick Farris was el­
ected as president of the Stratford 
4-H Club at their meeting at the 
school Tuesday morning. Mar­
jorie Boney wil serve as the vice- 
president and reporter. The se­
cretary will be Patsy Jean Coff­
man and Ruby Brannan, treasur­
er. There were thirteen girls 
present at the meeing.

The home demonstration agent. 
Miss Dorothy Dixon, very briefly 
discussed the 4-H club program.

Surplus Dalhart Air 
Field Buildings 
Offered For Sale

Surplus army buildings at the 
Dalhart Army Air Field went on 
sale to priority holders Wednesday, 
according to Morgan R. Lewis, de­
puty regional director of the War 
Assets Administratiton. The sale 
will continue through October 4.

Homer E. Massey, a negotiator 
representing WAA’s non-industrial 
real property division, will be at 
the air field office at Dalhart to 
assist interested purchasers in 
making their applications for these 
buildings.

Garrison Motor Co. 
Showing New 1946 
Chrysler Car

Garrison Motor Co. proudly an­
nounces the arrival of their new 
Chrysler car which is now on dis­
play in their show room. The new 
car arrived Tuesday morning. ^

Mr. Garrison states that he has 
a quota of three cars a month but 
that does not guarantee him de­
livery of that many.

J. T. Cartrite 
Injured In Fall 
From Scaffold

J. T. Cartrite, Sherman County 
farmer-stockman, was injured at 
his home in Canyon Saturday af­
ternoon when he fell from a scaf­
fold while repairing the house.

He is suffering from' iaack injur­
ies and a broken arm just above 
the left wrist.

Phillips'Squint 
Well Drilling 
At 2,357 Feet

The Phillips Squint No. 1 well, 
located in section 23, Block 1-C. 
GH&H, was drilling with rotary 
tools at 2,357 feet at the last re­
port.

The Shamrock Price No. 4 is 
drilling with cable tools with ap­
proximately 10 million cubic feet 
of gas escaping from the well.

The drilling site at the Shamrock 
Fisher No. 1 remains abandoned 
awaiting arrival of cable tools to 
complete the well for gas.

City Paving Project Discussed 
At Meeting In City Hall

Ralph Harding 
Dealer For The 
Quonset Huts

Ralph Harding announces 
addition of the Great Lakes 
Corporation to his line of 
ness this week in placing the 
steel “Quonset 40” huts before the 
public for their approval. These 
buildings provide a combination 
farm machine shed and granary.
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Spurlock News
There were 39 attending Sunday 

School Sunday.

Mrs. Remer Fedric, Steve and 
Threase, were Sunday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Spurlock and 

1 family.

Mr. and Mrs. Olen Branham of 
Sunray were Sunday guests of 
Mrs. Branham’s sister, Mrs. Alvin 
Spurlock, Mr. Spurlock and Kaye.

Mr. and Mrs. Meritt Sweny and 
Bob were Amarillo visitors Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Guy Sweny and 
Bob were Dumas visitors Wednes­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Spurlock 
and family, Elsie Pearle and Neal 
Spurlock attended the show in 
Sunray Thursday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Owen Hudson and 
family and Nell Foreman were Du­
mas visitors Saturday.

Political
Announcements
For Sheriff, Tax Assessor, and 

Collector:
JOHN KIDV/ELL.

Miss Nell Foreman of Stratford 
is spending a few days with her 
sister, Mrs. Owen- Hudson, Mr. 
Hudson and family.

Mr. and Mrs. D. E. Malone were 
Dalhart visitors Tuesday.

For County Judge and Ex-Officio 
Superintendent of Schools:
L. P. HUNTER.

Miss Alana Davis of Stratford 
spent the week end with Miss Billie 
Ann Ellison.

LaCiencia Club 
To Meet With 
Mrs. Burgess

The LaCiencia Club will meet 
Thursday of next week in the 
home of Mrs. Bob Burgess. Last 
week the club met in the home of 
Mrs. R. C. Wilkenson.

LOCAL NEWS
Bennie Simons left Saturday 

morning for Peabody College at 
Nashville, Tennessee, where he will 
work on his Ph. D. degree in library 
science. He was formerly employ­
ed as librarian at the library in 
Huntsville, Texas before entering 
the armed forces and after receiv­
ing his discharge. Mrs. Simons 
and children will remain in Strat­
ford at the home of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Allen.

Mrs. Clyde Martin was an Ama­
rillo visitor Thursday of last week.

J. A. Gunnels, Lone Wolf, Okla­
homa, is visiting this week in the 
home of his daugher and family, 
the T. D. Chisums.

O. C.
the W. 
day.

Jones, Friona visited in 
J. Thompson home Tues-

Baptist Revival 
Meeting W ill Close 
Sunday Night

Revival services which have been 
held daily at the local Baptist 
Church will close with the Sunday 
night services. Rev. H. L. White, 
Commerce, Texas, who has been 
delivering the evangelistic mes­
sages has won the admiration of 
large audiences. Edgar Spearman, 
Dallas, has been assisting the 
evangelist in leading the song 
services.

Mrs. Gill Entertains
Mrs. Thurman Gill gave a birth­

day party for her husband, Sun­
day, at 5:00 P. M. at the home of 
her mother, Mrs. W. J. Thompson.

The table was set on a lace 
tablecloth with tall yellow and 
white candles as decorations. The 
house was decorated with beautiful 
yellow flowers.

Hot chocolate, birthday cake, 
and watermelon were served to: 
Mr. and Mrs. John Kidwell, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wilbur Thompson, Ord- 
way, Colorado, Mr. and Mrs. W. J. 
Thompson, Misses Arlene Grimes, 
Dorohy Dixon, Woodford Kidwell, 
Mari jo Brown and Lor el Haile.

Jlalph Keener and Dick Diehl 
were in Amarillo Monday selling 
cattle at the Livestock auction.

Mrs. W. N. Price and baby 
daughter were brought home from 
Amarillo Thursday of last week. 
The  ̂little newcomer was named 
Dorothy Elizabeth.

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Phillips vis­
ited in Plainview over the week 
end.

For District Attorney, 69th Judicial 
District:
FLOYD H. RICHARDS.

For County Treasurer:
MRS. GERTRUDE WOODARD.

For County and District Clerk: 
MRS. LELAH BONEY.

For County Commissioner, Pre­
cinct No. 1:
ROSCOE DYESS.

For County Commissioner; 
cinct No. 2:
E. W. CARTER.

Pre-

For County Commissioner, Pre­
cinct No. 4:
E. E. HAMILTON. •

For State Representative, 124th 
Legislative District:
WILLIAM J. (Bill) CRAIG.

For District Judge, 69th Judicial 
District:
HARRY SCHULTZ.

Mr. and Mrs. V. W. Foreman and 
Janet were Sunday guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Owen Hudson and fam­
ily.

Mrs. Emma Simpson underwent 
an operation this week at the clin­
ic at Temple, Texas. Mary Simp­
son of Washington, D. C., is with 
her mother.

Miss Carol Sweny spent 
with her sister Mrs. N. W. 
Mr. Hudson and Gary.

Sunday
Hudson,

Mr. and Mrs. V. W. Foreman en­
tertained with a water melon feast 
Thursday night. Those attend­
ing were: Mr. and Mrs. Owen Hud­
son and family, Nell Foreman, Mr. 
and Mrs. N. W. Hudson and Gary, 
Mr. and Mrs. Orland Lasley and 
■Jannis, Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Las-

Upon the death of a worker who 
paid social security taxes, his next 
of kin should check with the Social 
Security Administration office, 
Amarillo, Texas. They may be 
eligible for payment under the old- 
age and survivors insurance pro­
gram.

ley and Ima Jeane.

Owen Hudson and Verne Fore­
man attended to business in Dal­
hart Monday.

Mrs. Ollie Mae Miley and Mrs. J. 
D. White of Erick, Oklahoma, vis­
ited from Sunday until Tuesday in 
the homft of Mr. and Mrs. C. G. 
Williams and family, and Mr. and 
Mrs. D. L. Miley.

Mr. and Mrs. C. F. Moon spent 
Sunday in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. C. G. Williams and family, 
and Mr. and Mrs. D. L.-Miley.

Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Lasley and 
baby visited in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. C. G. Williams and fam­
ily, and Mr. and Mrs. D. L. Miley 
Friday night.

CITATION BY PUBLICATION
(THE STATE OF TEXAS)

TO: J. M. NEWMAN, MAR­
GARET ARMSTRONG, ALICE 
STRANGE, MOLLIE WRIGHT, 
SPENCE NEWMAN, LAFAYETTE 
NEWMi)iN and the unknown heirs 
of J. M. Newman, Margaret Arm­
strong, Alice Strange, Mollie 
Wright, Spence Newman, and La­
fayette Newman, deceased, their 
heirs, devisees, legatees and legal 
representatives, GREETING:

You are commanded to appear 
and answer the plaintiff’s petition 
at or before 10 o’clock A. M. of the 
first Monday afer the expiration of 
42 days from the date of issuance 
of this Citation, the same being 
Monday the 11th day of November, 
A. D., 1946, at or before 10 o’clock 
A. M., before the Honorable Dis­
trict Court of Sherman County, at 
the Court House in Stratford, Tex­
as.

Said plaintiff’s petition ^̂ as filed 
on the 23rd day of September, 1946.

The file number of said suit be­
ing No. 1095.

The names of the parties in said 
suit are: G. L. Harland, and J.' M. 
Newman, Margaret Armstrong, 
Alice Strange, Mollie Wright, 
Spence Newman, Lafayette New­
man and the unknown heirs of J. 
M. Newman, Margaret Armstrong, 
Alic^ Strange, Mollie Wright, 
Spence Newman, Lafayette New­
man, deceased, their heirs, devisees, 
legatees and legal representatives, 
as Defendants.

The nature of said suit being 
substantially as follows, to wit: A 
suit in trespass to try title and for 
damages, wherein the plaintiff 
sues for the title and possession of 
Section twenty-three (23), Block 
One (1), Public Free School Land, 
Sherman County, Texas, as the 
same was thought to be bounded 
prior to the survey thereof by How­
ard T. Trigg in the yearT924, and 
including not only said half sec­
tion as surveyed by said Trigg, but 
the land to the north thereof and 
south of the State Line Highway 
(otherwise known as the Cimarron 
Base Line), for damages, and rents, 
and specially pleading the^five (5) 
and ten (10 year statutes of limi­
tation in support of his title to 
said land.

If his citation is not served with­
in 90 days after date of its issu­
ance; it shall be returned unserved.

Issued his the 23rd day of Sep­
tember, A. D., 1946.

Given under my hand and seal 
of said Court, at office in Strat­
ford, Texas, this the 23rd day of 
September, A. D., 1946.
(Seal) DISTRICT COURT OF 
SHERMAN COUNTY, TEXAS.

LELAH BONEY, Clerk, District 
Court, Sherman Countv, Texas.

9-26; 10-3-10-17

Faculty Members 
Honored With Tea 
Monday Afternoon

Facutly members of the Strat­
ford Schools were honored by the 
Stratford Parent Teachers Asso­
ciation with a tea Monday after­
noon in the home making rooms at 
the school building.

Teachers and other visitors were 
welcomed by Mrs. A. L. King, pro­
gram chairman.

Officers of the P. T. A., includ­
ing Mrs. B. B. Carter, membership 
chairman; Mrs. Tommie Wake­
field, Secretary; Mrs. Archie Ar­
nold, Treasurer; and Mrs. Herbert 
Folsom, publicity chairman, were 
introduced.

The program consisted of a song 
by Timmie Lou Flores, a reading 
by Jackie Williams, and a duet by 
Mrs. Frank Mehner and IMiss Fern 
Cunningham accompanied by Mrs. 
Hose Flores at the piano.

Mrs. M. E. Cleavinger, Jr., pour­
ed coffee for about 60 members 
and guests.

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to thank the people of 

Stratford for their kind deeds and 
contributions which have helped 
defray our recent , hospital ex­
penses.

Mr. and Mrs. Elbert Williams.

Rain Wednesday 
Night Covered 
Territory

Rains which fell in torrents 
Wednesday night of last week cov­
ered most of the local territory 
with heaviest rainfall west and 
east of Stratford where water is 
still standing in most all low 
places.

In Stratford the rain registered 
1.53 inches.

Rock Island In 
Trade For Riley 
Truck Line

The Rock Island Truck line is in 
a trade for the Riley truck line 
operating -through Stratford and 
the deal is now before the inter­
state commerce commisison for 
approval.

Verlon Haile’s Car 
Smashed In Accident 
Sunday Morning

Verlon Haile escaped without in­
injury Sunday morning when the 
right front fender of his Dodge se­
dan was smashed when he rammed 
a car parked on U. S. highway 54, 
5 miles southwest of Stratford. 
Haile was blinded by the lights of 
an approaching car.

Specialist Views 
Local Tree Sites

E. W. Johnson of the Woodward, 
Oklahoma experiment station was 
here’ Wednesday of last week view­
ing the shrubbery and tree sites at 
the homes of T. F. Baskin, Vernon 
Morris, John Knight and Leslie 
Keenan. He is watching the 
growth and adaptability of 
and shrubbery best suited to 
territory.

trees
this

Baptist Church
Sunday School 10:00 A. M.
Morning Worship 11:00 A. M.
Training Union 6:45 P. M.
Evening Worship 7:45 P. M.
Gospel Singer Edgar Spearman 

will direct the music and Rev. H. 
L. White will preach at b(5th the 
morning and evening services. We 
cordially invite you to come and 
worship with us.

Mayor G. R. Garrison, Aldermen 
H. E. Lowe, Leo Smith, Leslie H. 
Parker, and Brown Ross, City Se- 
cretg.ry, in a special called meet­
ing at the City Hall Monday night 
metiwith Cone Donelson, Van B. 
Boston, Joe A. Duby, W. F. Wigin- 
ton,NJohn Kidwell, Lester Plunk, 
Shuler Donelson, Eugene Hudson, 
and Virgil McGee, interested citi­
zens in paving approximately 40 
blocks of the streete in the busi­
ness and residential district of 
Stratford.

Contract estimates for paving 
the streets with a 6 inch caliche 
base, asphault and gravel, with 
curb and gutter, would cost the 
citizens of the town approximately 
$175.00 for each 30-foot lot. , This 
part of the paving it was thought 
would meet with very little opposi­
tion but this estimated cost did 
not include the street intersections 
nor the connecting east and west 
streets on which the paving cost 
would have to be distributed be- 
ween the lot owners on the block, 
as estimated cost of about $5,000 a 
block.

At first paving enthusiasts intro­
duced the idea of securing the pav­
ing pledges of as many residents of 
the town as possible and then fin­
ishing l;he paving project by pub­
lic sugseription. However when 
the estimated cost of the project 
was compleed, it was generally a- 
greed that the entire paving pro­
ject could not be carried out oth­
er than through floating a bond is­
sue.

As the demand for paving of 
the streets in Stratford grows, the 
City Council, will in all probability 
place the issue squarely before the 
residents of the town in the form 
of a bond issue election, in which 
the tax payers will be given the 
privilege of deciding by popular vote 
as to whether or not they want the 
paving, and if they favor a bond 
issue to do so.

The estimated cost of the paving 
project would be approximately 
$200,000.00. In the last two years 
the tax valuation of Stratford has 
increased to $1,000,000.00. This 
increase in taxable property has 
been due to the rapid building de­
velopment which has been taking 
place. It was estimated that by 
raising the tax valuation of the 
City property 25 percent the tax­
able revenue would be sufficient to 
retire the necessary outstanding 
bonds.

The plans for the paving include 
a 72-foot street for paving on Main 
Street and Grand Avenue and he 
paving of 42-foot streets in the 
residential sections.

Mrs. J. W. Shireman left "Tuesday 
for a few weeks visit with relatives 
in Illinois.

Methodist Church
Sunday School 10:00 A. M. 
Morning Worship U:00 A, M. 
Intermediate MYF 6:00 P. M. 
Senior MYF 6:30 P. M.
Evening Worship 7:30 P. M. 
Woman’s Society of Christian 

Service each Wednesday at 2:30 P. 
M.

Choir rehearsal each Wednesday 
at 7:30 P. M.

Youoh play night each Thursday 
evening at 7:30 P. M.

First Christian Church
Sunday School 10:00 A. M. 
Morning Worship 11:00 A. M. 
Christian Endeavor 6:30 P. M. 
Evening Services 7:30 P. M.
Choir practice 8:00 P. M. Wed­

nesday.
You are always welcome at any. 

and all these services.
G. M. Eastman, Pastor.

Assembly of God 
Church

Welcome to Assembly of God 
Church, across street from Court­
house.

Sunday School 10:00 A. M.
Morning Worship 11:00 A. M.
Evangelistic service Sunday ev­

ening 8:00 P. M.
Bible study and Prayer Meeting 

Thursday 8:00 P. M.

Church Of Christ
A. C. Huff, Minister.
Bible Classes 10:00 A. M.
Morning Services 11:00 A. M.
Evening Services 7:30 P. M.
Wednesday Evening Services 

8:00 P. M.
Our attendance and interest has 

been good during and since the 
meeting. The attendance Sunday 
a week at the morning service was 
56; collection $27.70. Last Sunday 
at the morning service 18 were in 
attendance with a collection of $20. 
We have secured a loan on our 
building and all business matters 
adjusted so we are prepared to pay 
for our building and the payments 
are not going to be any burden on 
us. We are glad that we will not 
need to ask for help from other 
churches to pay for the 
building. We thank God for these 
blessings.

We have arranged to have a 
midweek service on Wednesday ev­
ening at 8:00 o ’clock. Thirty 
minutes will be devoted to a song 
drill, followed by Bible readings, 
and prayers, by those who are pre­
paring themselves for leadership. 
We have good material. Come and 
enjoy our services with us. Our 
singing is good but we want it bet­
ter. Every one is welcome to all 
our services. »

A. C. Huff.
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The American W ay
Remove That Appendix

(By George Peck)
The shoutihg and the tumult

Stratford Lodge 874
A. F. & A. M.

stated

have died — tem-pwrarily. As this 
is being written there are no ma­
jor strikes in progress and none 
threatened for the very immediate 
future. The nation sits back with 
a sigh of relief, disaster having 
been narrowly averted, to indulge 
in wishful thinking to the effect 
that the worst is over and that la­
bor-management strife is perman­
ently ended.

The Congress, which was all hot

Communication
SECOND FRIDAY NIGHT OF 

EACH MONTH 
MELVIN PHILLIPS, W. M.
W. O. BRYANT. Secretary.

HOTEL STRATFORD
“Once a Guest—Always a Booster” 

Mrs. Areace LeBleu, Prop. 
Phone No. 7
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I❖*>
I
❖
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SEE OUR NEW  1946

Frigidaire Coldwall
N O W  ON DISPLAY  

N ATU R AL GAS FLOOR FURNACES  

ELECTRIC IRONS 

W A T E R  HEATERS
IN 20 AND 30 GALLON SIZES

ELECTRIC BATH ROOM  HEATERS  
FARM  RADIOS

Duby Plumbing &  Electric
STRATFORD, TEXAS

‘ ‘Your Frigidaire Dealer”

❖

❖

DEPOSITS INSURED
BYThe Federal Deposit Insurance Cerporatlon

$5000
WASHINGTON, D. C.

M A X IM U M  I N S U R A N C E  
F O R  E A C H  D E P O S I T O R $5000

Old Friends
Or

New Friends
- L- I «P

It doesn’t matter which you are, you 

will find that this bank is equiped and 

ready to meet your financial require­

ments.

Y O U  ARE W ELCOM E  
HERE

First State Bank
OF STRATFORD

Monitor
W ind
Mills

Now in stock in our storage rooms 

ready for your inspection.

Car Heaters
BOTH GASOLINE And HOT W A TE R

CIRCULATING HEATERS

FLOOR M A TS

TARPAULINS  
' For Trucks And Pick-Ups

Van B. Boston

and bothered and galvanized for 
action when the coal strike was on, 
a nation-wide rail strike threat­
ened and a maritime strike hang­
ing in the offing, has sunk back 
into its former state of apathy and 
laissez-faire, as far as enacting 
remedial legislation is concerned.

The settlements of the General 
Motors, steel, rail and coal strikes, 
and the averting of the maritime 
strike, however, but still uncured 
of his basic ailment.

The perilous situation through 
which the nation has just passed, 
can be likened to a man striken 
with an appendictis attack. He 
calls in his physician, who has him 
x-rayed. The x-ray shows a dis­
eased appendix, the only real cure 
for which is to chop it out. But, 
meanwhile, there has been sur­
cease from the stabbing pains, due 
to the application of ice. The pa­
tient, temporarily relieved, heeds 
not the advice of his physician, 
does not have the diseased api>en- 
dix removed, thus leaving himself 
subject to future distress and suf­
fering, perhaps premature death.

What we have done has been 
simply to apply the ice to the 
wound of our industrial patient. He 
is still a mighty sick man, kidding 
himself because for the moment 
he feels no pain, he is cured. He 
still has his diseased appendix, 
which in his case, is the Wagner 
Labor Relations Act. Until this 
sore spot in our industrial economy 
is removed, there can be no per­
manent labor-management peace.

This Act, acclaimed by union la­
bor as its “Magna Charta”, even­
tually will, if not repealed, be the 
Frankenstein monster to destroy 
union labor. Its discriminatory 
provisions against the employer, 
sooner, or later will destroy that 
employer. When that transpires, 
one of two things will happen to 
the worker. He will be out of a 
job, or he will be a slave working 
for the government, with his col­
lective bargaining and strike rights 
just cherished memories of a for­
mer happier period.

The point the workers of this 
nation must realize is that what 
hurts the boss, sooner or later 
gets around to hurting them. One 
of the irresponsible labor leaders, 
more forthright than his contem­
poraries, openly acknowledged 
that the Wagner Act hurts the boss 
when he said: “Sive, we know the 
Wagner Act favors us over man­
agement. H—, that’s why we’re
against changing it.”

Permanent cure for industrial 
strife will not come from new Ta­
bor laws. Such laws will only 
bring a flock of new bureaus and 
bureaucrats to administer them, 
more government controls, more 
public employees eating at the 
public trough. Through our his­
tory we have repealed laws when 
x-ray showed they were a disease 
upon the body economic. The x- 
ray shows the Wagner Act, passed 
by Congress with the high hope 
that it would prevent industrial 
strife, has acutally increased in­
dustrial strife. 'Hie Wagner Act 
has aggravated the wound, and the 
common sense thing to do now, is 
to repeal it.

Anything shorr or this will sim­
ply be applying ice to the wound, 
be but a temporary palliative. For 
the future welfare of our industrial 
economy, our labor laws need an 
appendectomy. The appendix — 
the Wagner Labor Relations Act 
must be removed.

seem to be dead and decaying af­
ter a treatment of 2,4-D, Trew 
says, but persimmon and pin oak

RESULTS WITH 2, 4-D
• After a series of experiments 

with the weed-killer 2,4-D, Cass 
County Agricultural Agent E. M. 
Trew, Jr., reports that the chemi­
cal has totally killed~common this­
tle and bull nettle, roots and all. 

Several other shrub species also

A  RECIPE FOR

Beauty
The recipe for Beauty is yours at 

the Pioneer Beauty Shop with Per­
manents, Shampoos, Fingerwaves 
Manicures, and Facials. It’s as 
simple as that.

. Please Phone 17 For 
Appointments

Pioneer Barber And 
Beauty Shop

are resprouting. The county a- 
gent believes that the treatment 
date, July 17, was too late for best

results.

Read Star Ads — It Pays

ABSTRACTS
W E  H A V E  A  COMPLETE  

ABSTR ACT PLANT
Covering All Real Estate In Sherman 

County
W e Furnish Quick, Efficient Service 

On Short Notice

Sherman County Abstract Co.
Royal Pendleton, Manager Stratford, Texas

Santa Fe
. . .  fo the colorful Southwest

4  4Santa Fe !

That’s right, chico;
 ̂ And “all the way” in the finest, modern style — and 
now on new and faster schedules.

For Santa Fe feels a great debt to nature for the color­
ful, romantic land through which it runs—and a real 
responsibility to our patrons, to take them through it 
in the finest way.
Let your Santa Fo Agont help with your travol plans

1477-B

To those who eagerly await
their new Chevrolets, • •

Here Is the Latest News 
about Chevrolet. r ’

Deliveries
Everybody from factory fo dealer is doing everything 

^ that can be done to speed deliveries to you

We have been informed by the Chevrolet Motor Division that 
the post month has witnessed oniy o slight improvement in 
the rote of production of new Chevrolet passenger cars. As 
a result, shipments of new ears to dealers for delivery are 
still far below the level we and the factory had hoped to 
attain by this time. In fact, through August, Chevrolet’s 
output of cars in 1946 was only 22.6% of the number turned 
out during the corresponding period of 1941.

We know that Chevrolet is doing everything possible to 
step up its production totals—to ship more and more cars to 
us and to its thousands of other dealers throughout America 
. . .  and we know, too, that we ore assured of getting our full 
proportionate shore of the current output and of future 
production gains.

Disappointing os the total figures hove been—and despite 
the fact that Chevrolet was out of production entirely during 
the first three months of the year—it is nevertheless true 
fhot Chevrolet led all other manufacturers in production of 
passenger cars during June 1946, and has continued to main­
tain it  ̂jeod in total production from that day to this.

We shall continue to moke deliveries of new Chevrolets 
fo our customers just os fast os we receive them; we regret 
delays os deeply os you do; we thank you for your friendly 
patience and understanding; and we promise you o new high 
motoring experience when you take delivery of your new 
Chevrolet, giving BIG-CAR QUALITY AT LOWEST COST!

Keep Your 
Present Car Alive

Meanwhile, may we suggest 
that you safeguard your 
transportation by bringing 
your car to us for service now 
and at regular intervals. Let 
us help you to keep it in good 
running condition—to main­
tain its performance, appear­
ance and resale value—until 
the day when your new Chev­
rolet comes along.

YOUR SYMBOL OF SERVICE

Davis Motor Co Stratford, Texas
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The Veterans Administration is

Expecting A New Shipment Of
Motorola

Car Radios
1,000 HOUR BATTERIES 

BATTERIES
For A4̂  Types of Radios

A  Few New 
R A D I O S

ALL TYPES OF CAR AERIALS 
RADIO TUBES

Radio Speakers and Vibrators
Repair Work Guaranteed For 30 

Days

Radio Service
**Where Radio is a Business and 

Not Just Another Side-line”

Cleaning
AND

Pressing
—COURTEOUS

—DEPENDABLE

—SERVICE

—SIX DAYS A WEEK

Where Your Patronage Is Appre­
ciated.

N. D. Kelp
CLEANING AND PRESSING

still grappling with the problem of 
getting nurses although it offers 
salaries and other benefits well a- 
bove private scales, Miss Dorothy 
MacLeod, Chief Nurse in the Dal­
las Branch Of fie of VA, said this 
week.

VA hospitals in Texas, Louisiana, 
and Mississippi, are short 400 nurses 
Miss MacLeod said. In some hos­
pitals, notably the huge installa­
tion at Temple, Texas, formerly 
operated by the Army, VA has had 
to restrict the entrance of patients, 
she added.

Appealing especially to former 
nurses in the armed forces, Miss 
MacLeod said: “Thousands of the 
younger boys and men of World 
War II, so well cared for by Army 
and Navy nurses, are now in VA 
hospitals. They still need your 
help.”

Salaries for VA nurses range 
from $2,645 to $5,905 per year. Miss 
MacLeod said. In addition, VA 
offers retirement pensions, recrea­
tional facilities and other benefits 
under a new Department of Medi­
cine and Surgery.

VA is now planning a program 
of training that Will be attractive 
to younger nurses just coming out 
of schools. Miss MacLeod said.

Application forms for amputee 
veterans to use in obtaining cars 
at government expense are expect­
ed to be available from VA offices 
in the Dallas Branch Area in a- 
bout two weeks, VA announced this 
week.

VA is responsible for administer­
ing the new $30,000,000 program 
enacted by Congress to provide 
automobiles or other conveyances 
for disabled veterans of World War 
n who are “ entitled to compen­
sation for the loss, or loss of use, 
of one or both legs at or above 
the ankle.”

Veterans who think they are en­
titled to receive cars can obtain 
the necessary forms and informa­
tion from VA contact representa­
tives in all larger communities. 
QUESTIONS AND ANSWERS

Q. What amount of guaranty 
may be issued on behalf of any one 
eligible veteran?

A. Up to $4,000 on real estate or 
up to $2,000 on personal property 
or business loans, and on more 
than 50 per cent of any loan may 
be guaranteed.

Q. If part of the guaranty has 
been used, how is the remaining 
guaranty computed?

A. To compute the used guaran­
ty, subtract the amount of realty 
loan from $4,000. The sum remain-

SET YOUR SIGHTS
• It fakes  ̂\  ^

planning ^
to achieve 
a goal

Some young men know what they want and plan for it. Others are 
still looking for their niche. The new Regular Army can help both.

Perhaps you want to go to college but can’t afford it. If you 
enlist in the Army, you’ll get your chance. Honorably discharged 
after a three-year enlistment, you are eligible for 48 months of edu­
cation at any college, trade, or business school for which you can 
qualify. The Government will pay your tuition, laboratory fees, 
etc., up to $500 per ordinary school year, plus $65 a month living 
allowance—$90 a month if you have dependents.

If you haven’t fecund yo\ir spot, an Army enlistment offers you 
training in any of 200 trades and skills. You leave the service eligible 
for further training at the best civilian schools.

You can assure yourself of the benefits of the GI Bill of 
Rights if you enter the Army on or before October 5, 1946. 
See your nearest Army Recruiting Station for details.

HIGHLIGHTS OF REGULAR ARMY ENLISTMENT
1. Enlistments for IV2, 2 or 3 years. 
( 1-year enlistments permitted for 
men now in the Army with 6 or more 
months of service.)
2. Enlistment age from 18 to 34 
years inclusive (17 with parents’ 
consent) except for men now in 
Army, who may reenlist at any age, 
and former service men depending 
on length of service.
3. A  reenlistment bonus .of $50 for 
each year of active service since such 
bonus was last paid, or since last 
entry into service, provided reenlist- 
ment is within 3 months after last 
honorable discharge.

4 . A  furlough for men who reenlist 
within 20 days. Full details of other 
furlough privileges can be obtained 
from Recruiting Officers.
5. Mustering-out pay (based upon 
length of service) to all men w:;o 
are discharged to enlist or reenlist.
6. Option to retire at half pay for 
the rest of your life after 20 years’ 
service—increasing to three-quarters 
pay after 30 years’ service. All pre­
vious active federal military service 
counts toward retirement.
7. Choice of branch of service and 
overseas theater (of those still open) 
on 3-year enlistments.

H EW , H IG H E R  PAY FO R  A R M Y  M E N
l i  Addition to Food, LodginR,

CMkes mnI Medicnl Care
Addition to Column One 

M the Right: 20% In­
crease for Service Over- 
acas. 50% Increase if Mem­
ber of Flying or Glider 
Crews. 5% Increase in Pay 
ior Each 3 Y ears of Service 
May Be Added. v

Master Sergeant 
or First Sergeant 

Technical Sergeant 
Staff Sergeant • • 
Sergeant . . • •
Corporal . . . .  
Private First Class 
Private . . . .

Starting 
Bate Pay 

Per 
Month

^ 1 6 5 .0 0
1 3 5 .0 0
1 1 5 .0 0
100.00

9 0 .0 0
8 0 .0 0  
7 5 .0 0

MONTHLY ^ 
RETIREMENT 

INCOME AFTER:
20 Years' 30 Years' 
Service Service

^ 1 0 7 .2 5  ^ 1 8 5 .6 3  
8 7 .7 5  1 5 1 .8 8
7 4 .7 5
6 5 .0 0  
5 8 .5 0
5 2 .0 0
4 8 .7 5

1 2 9 .3 8
1 1 2 .5 0
1 01 .25

9 0 .0 0
8 4 .3 8

Listen to; "IVorriors o f f'ea ce ,"  "Voice of 
the A rm y," "Proudly (Ve H a il,"  and Maior 
Football Broadcasts on yoiir radio.

E N L IS T  NOW  A T  Y O U R  N EA R ES T  
U .S . A R M Y R EC R U IT IN G  S TATIO N

A  G O O D  J O B  F O R  Y O U

M* A r m y t
■ ^ ' C H O O S E  T H I S : i :
F I N E  P R O F E S S I O N ;  F ^ O V / t

AM ARILLO RECRUITING OFFICE
POST OFFICE BUILDING AMARILLO. TEXAS

ing is the amount of realty guar­
anty available, or half that amount 
is the sum of personal property or 
business loan guaranty available.

Q. Are there any circumstances 
under which the guaranty may ex­
ceed 50 per cent of the loan?

A. Yes. Where a Federal Agency 
has made or is to make a guaran-  ̂
teed or insured loan for any of the 
eligible purposes, and the veteran 
needs a fully guaranteed second 
loan. This second loan may be 
fully guaranteed if—

(a) the amount involved is not 
in excess of the veteran’s available 
guarantee, and

(b) the loan is not in excess of

20 per cent of'the purchase price 
or cost.

Q, May several veterans use the 
guaranty to acquire property 
jointly?

A. Yes, but the total amount 
guaranteed may not exceed 50 per 
cent of the loan or the total enti­
tlement for guaranty of the veter­
ans, whichever is lesser. No loan 
may be guaranteed to exceed 50% 
except a loan secondary to one 
made, guaranteed or insured by a 
Federal Agency. •

Q. May a lender require securiy, 
in addition to the property being 
purchased, if the lender is not sat­
isfied with the loan without addi-

Straitford Abstract Co.
Minnie Laura Jackson, President

Incorporated 1907 ------ 39 yeara of .Satisfactory Service to
Sherman County Land Owners

Let Us Make Your Abstracts
WE SHOW THE RECORDS

THE COMPANY OF SERVICE 
Office on Comer of Main Street and Grand Avenue

Prepare Your Car
For Fall Driving

Keep your car in sound condition, keep it serving de­
pendably, by letting us tune it up for fall driving.

Come to our service station for skilled 
dependable, car-saving service, and 
give your car the benefit of our four-fold 
service advantages: expert mechanics, 
modem tools, genuine parts, and qual­
ity materials.

Davis Motor Co.
YO U R  CHEVROLET DEALER”

tional security?
A. Yes. This is a matter between 

the veteran and the lender. The 
VA does not object to its being giv­
en if the veteran is willing to give 
it.

Q. Is the guaranty or insurance 
privilege of a veteran restored to 
its original amoimt when the in­
debtedness is repaid.

A. No.

Bead Star Ads—It Pays

RATS RATS RATS 
Honest John’s Rat and Mouse 

Exterminator will really kill them. 
Sold exclusively by YATES DRUG

WE HAVE JUST RECEIVED A SHIPMENT OF NEW

Inner Spring Mattresses

Select your mattress today, our supply is limited. 
Just Received A New Shipment Of

FLOOR And TABLE LAM PS  
Something New!

NcNahen Furnitare
(Your Complete Home Furnishing Establishment)

It’s a k  V  IV  V  Story 

About Your Electric Power Supply
!

Reddy Kilowatt says:
N ow  that you are being served by our company, I think that you w ould 
probably like to know how" capable we are. It’s a L-O -N -G  story. But I’ll 
make it short by saying that now your community is being served from  
an efficient electric power grid system which receives its electrical energy i ' 
from  numerous large steam turbine generating plants.

' In other words there are four large steam turbine power plants within' 
the immediate vicinity o f the north Panhandle, assuring an abundance o f 

y  dependable, low -cost electric power.

S O U T H W E S T E R N

PUBLIC SERVICE
C O M P A N Y

22 T E A R S  o r  COOD C I T I Z E N S H I P  A N D  P U B L I C  S E R V I C E

wm m m B
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Local News
Mr. and Mrs. Earl E. Shirk spent 

four days last week visiting friends 
and relatives and attending the 
Kansas State Fair in Hutchinson, 
Kansas.

and Mrs. John Reece, came in last 
week from Compton, California, 
where they had been on business 
for the past three weeks.

Mr. and Mrs. Edward ‘ Brannan 
have moved to the Cactus plant at 
Etter where he has employment.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Lee, Shirley Mr. and Mrs. Donald Moon at-

<F

Tires Recapped
Disc Rolling

Acetylene And 
Arc Welding

Please bring your work in ear­
ly and give us an opportunity to 
have your equipment ready for 
the harvest season
RENDIX RADIOS, UNIVERSAL APPLIANCES, GOOD YEAR 
A TIRES, And CAR BATTERIES

TRACTOR AND IMPLEMENT TIRES OF ALL KINDS 
AUTOMOTIVE ACCESSORIES

Davis Brothers
Wright Davis, Mgr.

W A sri^ fR S i!

CUSTOM  SLAUGHTERING PRICES 
. Beef— Hide, Heart, Liver, and Head

Slaughtering and Curing PORK  
4 J Cents a pound live weight

CLEAN, SANITARY HANDLING GUARANTEED
DALHART DAIRY PRODUCTS

Homogenized Milk, Quart 19c

Pasteurized Milk, Quart 18c
Coffee Cream, 2  Pint 21c

Stratford Frozen Food Lockers

Our Doll Show
NOW  SHOW ING: ^

M U G SY and M A R G Y  
Leading The Parade

Dolls that Walk 
Dolls that Talk 
Dolls that Sleep 

With Artificial Teeth 
In the Rear of Our Store

Y O U  WILL FIND THEM  GALORE
W E INVITE YO U  TO

Visit Our Doll Show
50 PAIR NYLON HOSE FREE

Bonar Pharmacy
Your Registered Store

Mrs. L. E. BONAR,*Pharmacist PHONE 29

ONE LOT LADIES

House Dresses
Sizes 12 to 20

$ < 3 .8 0

Separate
SLACKS

And
SLACK
SUITS

$5.95 to $14.95

LADIES ALL W OOL  
PLAID  

SHIRTS 
$8.95

Large Assortment Of 
SW EATERS  

For Men, Women 
And Children

McIntosh Dry Goods

M EN’S 
LEATHER  
JACKETS

AND

SHEEP 
LINED 
COATS

SW EATERS

Khaki Coveralls, | 
Shirts and Pants

Men’s and Ladies House
SHOES

Lovelace Department Store

visited relatives here from Sunday 
until Wednesday.

Miss Irene Shamblin and G. W.

Clark, Amarillo, were guests in the 
Dick Diehl home from Wednesday 
until Friday.

tended the Kansas state fair 
Hutchison, Kansas Friday

in

Louis and Owen Gunnels, who 
run the Safeway Taxicab in Ama­
rillo, visited in the home of their 
uncle and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. T. D. 
Chisum, Sunday. v

\ . ______
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Gibbons and 

children, Texhoma, visited their 
mother, Mrs. J. T. Gibbons, Suh- 
day.

Mr. and Mrs. D. B. Grimes left 
Tuesday for an (extended visit with 
friends and relatives in Missouri 
and Arkansas. /

Mrs. D. L. Buckles had as a guest 
Tuesday her daughter, Mrs. J. L. 
Fuqua, Jr., of Fort Morgan, Colo­
rado.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Diehl 
Gruver visitors Sunday.

were

^Mrs. Earl Carter, Dalhart, visited 
Mrs. J. T, Gibbons Sunday.

Mrs. M. L. Keener came home 
from Amarillo, Sunday, where she 
had been the last two weeks visit­
ing her daughter and family, the 
Jess Mulherins.

Virgil Chisum, Dumas, spent 
the week end with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. T. D. Chisum.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Ke,lp, Hot 
Springs, New Mexico, came in 
Tuesday and visited relatives here 
until F̂ riday.

Mr and Mrs. Jimmie Jackson and 
Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Mathews vis­
ited friends in Dumas Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jimmie Barnes 
were business visiors in Dalhart 
Wednesday morping.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Diehl and 
Howard Gibbons were in Clapham, 
New Mexico Wednesday looking

W A N T  ADS
FOR SALE: 6 single 24x24 inch 

Anderson Window Frarnes; 1 dou­
ble 24x24 inch Anderson Window 
Frame: 1 single 24x14 inch Ander­
son Window Framet— See George 
Allen. 51-ltc

FOR SALE: Used Desk and Used 
Library Table.— McMahen Furni­
ture Co. 51-ltc

FOR SALE: 20 acres, tract 8, of 
section 16, the south 1-2 of the 
northeast 1-4 of the northeast 1-4, 
Block 2-B, G. H. & H., Sherman 
County, Texas, for $1,000.00. —Mrs. 
Anna Jackson, Brandon, Florida.

50-2tp.
FOR SALE: 5 lots nicely located 

between the school and town, one 
block off Main street. Side walk 
across front, sewer accessable in 
alley. If interested write: W. A. 
Hugg, Manager, J. C. Penney Com­
pany, Clayton, New Mexico. 49-3tc

General Electric Appliances. — 
Lovelace Motor & Equipment. 44c

Not Only Good — 
OUR FOOD  

Is The Best

You are always welcome in the

Palace Cafe
RUSSELL BEALL, Proprietor

after cattle they have on pasture 
there.

Mrs. Ed Garoutte came home 
Tuesday from Oklahoma- .rCity, 
where she has been for the past 
two weeks for medical treatment.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lollis and Jess 
Hass of Hot Springs, New Mexico,

W HOLESOM E

Drinks
VITAM IN S

RED ARROW  

And

REXALL

M EDICATIONS

You are assured friendly, 
; ' courteous service at all times

—— ..s at Your REXALL STORE,

YATES DRUe

NOTICE
❖  ^

___  _____ _____________ ______________  ❖
♦>- ❖ -
❖ - ❖  ❖  *> ❖  ❖
❖  *>-
❖

❖  ❖ - ❖
❖
❖  ❖  ❖  ❖  *>
❖  *>■ ❖  ❖

The Gas and Electric Offices of the Southwestern Public Ser­

vice Company will be combined October 1st.

You will reecive your Gas Bill along with your Electric Bill 

and BOTH WILL BE PAYABLE A T  THE OLD W EST T E X A S  

UTILITIES OFFICE.

I have enjoyed serving you the past seven years as local man­

ager of the Southwestern Public Service Company, and am sure 

Chester Guthrie^will do his utmost in the future to carry out the 

high standard policies of the company.

Southwestern

Public Service Company
Joe Duby

Economical to buy, maintain and add to, the “ Quonset 40”  is an 
ideal building for many farm uses. Its all-steel, arch-rib construc­
tion—fire-safe, rot-proof, sag-proof and warp-proof—provides 
100% usable floor space. 40' wide by any length desired, in exten­
sions of 20', the ’ ‘Quonset 40” is simple and speedy tb erect. Its 
framework of Stran-Steel features a patented nailing groove for 
quick and easy attachment of collateral materials. 12'xl2' sliding 
door, four windows and ventilator in each end panel are standard 
equipment; additional windows can be installed in front and sides 
if required. Let us give you complete details and prices on this 
and other Stran-Steel buildings today.

“ Quonset”  buildings 
and Stran-Ste^ framing 

are products of 
Great Lakes Stee< Corporation 

unit of National Steel Corporation

RALPH HARDING

*>*>❖❖❖❖

❖ Iw

❖♦i*-❖❖
*>
4-*>♦>❖
*>
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DOCTORS OFFICE HOURS
STRATFORD CITY HALL

Dr. J. P. Price, Jr., Durnas
Osteopathic Physician and Surgeon

Will Be Present
Fridays, 8 :00 to 12:00 A. M. 
Dr. W . D. Maxwell, Dalbart

Osteopathic Physician and Surgeon
Tuesdays 1:00 to 6:00 P. M.

STUDEBAKER SALES &  SERVICE
COMPLETE PARTS STOCK ------ ACCESSORIES

Fully equipped Body and Paint Shop 
Complete Mechanical Service on all Makes of Cars. 

AUTO GLASS
Phone or write for appointment.

KOEHLER M OTOR C O M PAN Y
P. O. Box 1072Phone 123

« 302 Rock Island Ave. Dalhart, Texas

Wilson funeral Directors
AM BULANCE SERVICE  

FUNERAL SERVICE
Boise City, Okla. .• Stratford, Texas

Phone 31 Phone 60

Pleasing Foods
You are invited to visit our counter

and tables for pleasing foods served in

an atmosphere of friendly environment.
♦

It is our intention to serve meals just 

as you wish them, seasoned to your parti­

cular taste. ,

Grady^s Cafe

Buy the Best for Less
Special Friday and Saturday
FREE DELIVERY SERVICE BEGINNING  
M O N D A Y A T  10:00 A . M. AND 6:00  P. M.

FLOUR
Purasnow

W H ITE SPUDS
No. 1
10 Pounds IS
LIM A BEANS
Del Haven 
No. 2 Can 
- For S i
LUNCHEON M EAT
Black Hawk 
Can S9
VERMICELLI A  
Box —
ORANGE JUICE 
Adams 
46 Ounces S8
TO M A TO  SOUP
Rancho 
lO J. Ounce
Can ^
OATS
Purity 
1 Pound 4  
Ounces 12

Now Show ings
The New

Chrysler
In Our Show Rooms 

W e will soon be in a position to fur­
nish parts and service this make of car.

RECEIVED NEW SHIPMENT OF

Seat Covers
FOB MOST LATE MODELS AND MAKES OF CARS

CAR W ASH IN G  AND GREASING  
M AGN O LIA

Wholesale and Retail Products

Garrison Motor Co.
LOCAL NEW S

Mr. and Mrs. Earl Bond were 
business visitors in Dalhart Wed­
nesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Kelp, 
bons, were Amarillo visitors, 
Thursday.

--------- i."' •
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Diehl were in 

Dalhart Thursday attending the 
livestock auction.

Mr. and Mrs. John K. Shaw, San 
Diego, California, will arrive today 
for a visit with Mrs. Shaw’s daugh­
ter, Mrs. Baskin Brown, and her 
sister, Mrs. Homer Smith, and oth­
er relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Edgar Brannan, 
Amarillo, moved to Etter this week 
where he is employed with the

PRUNE BUTTER

Jar 41

25 Pound 
Sack

$ 1 8 9
1 ^

BAKING POWDER
Clabber Girl 
25 Ounce 
Can 2 3
COFFEE ' 
Fireside 
1 Pound S 4
APPLES
Cooking
Bushel

$ ^ .2 0  1
PEANUT BUTTER I
Armour’s
2 Pound 
Jar 4 ^  1
CORN FLAKES  
Kellogg’s X 
11 Ounce 
Package 1 2
OYSTER CRACKERS  
? 2  Pound $H .15 
Box “
TOILET SOAP  
Grandpa’s A  
Bar ^

ALBERT'S
Grocery & Market

GOOD COFFEE

AND

GOOD FOODS

AT ALL TIMES

OPEN DAILY FROM 5:30 A. M.
UNTIL 9:00 P. M.

Except Tuesday, when we will be 
Closed All Day.

M ID W A Y  CAFE
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Salmon

Cactus' plant.

Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Moon, who 
attended a wedding anniversary in 
Pratt, Kansas the latter part of 
the week, attended the state fair in 
Hutchison, Kansas Tuesday.

L. P. Hunter, Miss Caroline Hun­
ter, and Mr. and Mrs. W. T. Crab­
tree visited Mrs. M. R. Robinson in 
Neblett hospital at Canyon Tues­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Virgil Garoutte 
will leave today for Ojo
Caliente, New Mexico to bring
home Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Garoutte.

Ernest Lovelace" and Chester 
Pitmk were business » visitors in 
Amarillo Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Royal Pendleton 
were visitors in Amarillo Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. C. W. Hill and 
daughter, Helen June, Dodge City, 
Kansas were here Sunday bringing 
home Mr. and Mrs. E. Hill.

vCarroll Wisdom, returned to his 
hbme in Jefferson City, Missouri 
the first of the week after a visit 
ĵdth relatives and friends in 

Stratford.

Mrs. Harry Vincent, Texhoma, 
was a Sunday afternoon guest of 
Mr. and Mrs. F. L. Yates.

Mr. and Mrs. F. B. Mullins and 
Miss Lois Mullins were visitors in 
Amarillo Thursday.

Mrs. W. L. Tinnin, who has been 
a guest in the home of Mr. and

Mrs. G. L. Taylor, returned to her 
home in San Antonio Sunday ev­
ening.

S. M. McMinn,. Walnut Springs, 
Texas, is here for a visit^With'his 
son, O. L. McMinn.

Bicycle Tires 
And Tubes

W e Have the Standard 26x1.125 
Tires and Tubes to fit all makes of Bicy­
cles.

CIRCULATING AND RADIANT  
N ATU R AL GAS HEATERS

Old Established Quality Brands Of 
TENNIS RACKETS And TENNIS 

BALLS

Cowdrey Hwd. & Impl.
J. I. CASE SALES AND SERVICE

Ne i t h e r  bitter hardships nor hostile In-̂  
dians could daunt the pioneer farmer, but 

the rich prairie soil o f the new West broke his 
heart. With no pbow to turn the greasy, black 
loam after the first breaking, the frontiersman 
was forced either to grub an uncertain existence 
from it or to move westward to new^irgin land.

In 1837, at Grand Detour, Illinois, a plow 
tamed the wild prairie! It was John Deere’s 
new plow with a steel moldboard which shed 
the sticky prairie soil. At last, the pioneer 
farmer could unhitch his emigrant wagon and 
take root in the fertile plains o f the West.

Times, methods, and machines have changed,
 ̂ hut John Deere Plows have never relinquished their 

century-old leadership. Let us show you how it will 
pay you to own a John Deere.

Bennett Implement Co

Truck Tires
8-PLY TIRES IN SIZES 9:00x20

8:25x20 and 7:00x20 9.^,^

Tractor Tires
In Sizes 15x32 — 14x32 — 15x28 — 15x24»

Tractor Tubes '
To Fit Most Any Size Tractor Tire 

W E H A V E  A  GOOD SUPPLY OF ‘

6:00x16 Tubes
Price Range of $3.00 to $3.95 

CAR W ASH IN G  AND GREASING

Consumers Co.
I

“ W e Are Open 24 Hours A  Day’’

That's the 12 Million Dollar Question of your Public Service Co.

There are just about as many 
answers to that question as there 
are people in the Panhandle Plains 
Pecos Valley area.A  PIONEER 

IN BUILDING 
AH EAD FOR 
THE FUTURE Your Public Service Company's 

12 miliion dollar expansion pro­
gram will benefit e v e ro n e .

There’ll be many new industries 
using low  cost, reliable electric 
power, more homes with the ad­
vantages of electrical living, more 
farmers taking on Reddy Kilowatt 
as their new ’ 'hired hand” .

W e’re happy that in our 22nd year, 
we’re a pioneer in building ahead 
for the future. Our expansion pro^ 
gram will bring better living, elec­
trically, to everyone in the years to 
come.

Another in a series of advertisements designed to help build this fast-growing territory
in which we serve.

SOUTHWESTERN '

P ifff£ /C  SERVICE
COMPANY

22 T E A R S  or COOD C I T I Z E N S H I P  A N D  P U B L I C  S E R V I C E
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BOBBY
SOX

“ Here she comes . . . Just keep talking as though her 
whole life wasn’t really ruined ’ cause she didn’t 

get a letter from Warren today!”

'W y
CROSS
T O W N

By
Roland Coe

“ Well, you cried when I had mine cut!”

NANCY
NANCY.'— STOP CHASINS THAT 
PIC — you  SHOULD ALWAYS 
8E KINO TO ANIMALS

SEWING CIRCLE PAHERNS

re56 ^ in i^  ^ o t
Pattern No. 8085 comes in sizes 2, 3,

5 -and 6 years. Size 3, dress 1% yard! 
of 39-inch; panties, % yard.

The FALL and WINTER issue of FASH­
ION is now ready . . . that sparkiing pat­
tern magazine that’s new and different. 
Fifty-two pages of smart fashions keyed 
directly to the needs of every woman who 
sews. Special American Designer Origl- 
nals . . . beauty and home-making sec­
tions . . . exciting junior original design 
. . . free printed pattern inside the book. 
It’s exactly what your readers are wait­
ing for! Price 85 cents.

SEWING CIRCLE PATTERN DEPT. 
530 South WeUs St. Chicago 7, m.

Enclose 25 cents in coins for each 
pattern desired.
Pattern No_________________ Sizo
Name______________________________
Address.

For the Sweet Little Miss 
C HE’LL look as pretty as a pic- 
^  ture in this dainty little yoke 
dress. Pleats give the full swing­
ing skirt little g i r l s  love, and 
there’s a tiny Peter Pan collar 
edged in narrow lace. Panties to 
match.

Biggest Census
The biggest census in history is 

to be taken in 1950. It will in­
clude all Western Hemisphere na­
tions. They have an estimated 
population of 300,000,000.

Facts about health, education, 
standards of living and trade wiP 
be gathered.

Gas on Stomach
Relieved in 5 minutes or doable your money back

When excess stomach acid causes painful, su ffocat­
ing; gas, sour stomach and heartburn, doctors osaaUjr 
prescribe the fastest-acting medicines know n fo r  
sm p tom a tic  re lie f— medicines like those in B ell-ena  
Tablets. N o laxative. Bell-ana brings com fort in  «  
j i f f y  or  double your m oney back on return o f  bottle 
to  us. 26c at all druggists.

SC RATCHING LO OKS BAD
Don’t do it. When your head 
itches from dry scalp, do this 
—rub in just a few drops o f  
MOROUNE HAIR TONIC

Jl/a
fyilures

BECAUSE YEAST GOT WEAK

N e w  Fleischmann’ s Fast Rising D ry  Yeast keeps 
fo r weeks on you r pantry shelf
If you bake at home—you can always 
depend on New Fleischmann’s Fast Rising 
Dry Yeast to give you perfect risings 
... delicious bread... every time you bake!

Ready for instant action—New Fleisch­
mann’s Fast Rising keeps fresh and 
potent for weeks—lets you bake at a 
moment’s notice! Don’t risk baking fail­
ures with weak yeast—get New Fleisch­
mann’s Fast Rising today. At your grocer’s.

i TOdSties
■ .i’:?

\
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CLASSIFIED
D E P A R T M E N T
BUSINESS & INVEST. OPPOR.

home: a n d  a u t o  s u p p l y  store :. Se­
cure your future. Franchise and merchan­
dise available now for new Associate 
Stores. Investigate before you invest. 

Write or wire.
KEINYON AUTO STOREIS, Dallas 1. Tex.

GROCERY
Garage, feed, gas station and farm com­
bination. 120 acres, 40 pasture, 45 corn, 
25 hay. 5 room house, excellent condition, 
gross business $2500 month. REA elec­
tricity, water system on farm, to market 
gravel road, school bus. 14 miles Nevada. 
Mo., entire grocery stock, feed, gasoline, 
auto parts. Vs of crop, 8 foot electric box, 
$10,000 for entire business. Picture show 
once every week. If interested come and 
see or write. OLA FENTON, Milo, Mo.

D0GS, CATS, PETS, ETC.
PUPPIES WANTED

We buy puppies of all kinds, also kittens, 
canaries, parrots, etc. Give description 
and lowest dealer’s price in first letter.GEISLER PET STORE 
)13 No. 16th St.. Omaha i. Nebr.. Since 188S

FARMS AND RANCHES
656 ACRES—Best creek bottom; Latimer 
Co., Ok.; close to school; 10 miles from 
coimty Seat; $25 per acre; V* down; terms; 
400,000 ft. hardwood timber; 2 houses and 
improvements: 3 wells: ranch; all fenced; 
130 acres of Bermuda grass: 200 acres in 
cultivation; ideal ranch for hogs and 
cattle: Vs royalties reserved.ADDRESS BOX 96 - Lincoln, Kansas.

HAY, GRAIN, FEED
Certified Pawnee Wheat by sack, truck, car­
load. $2.50 bushel recleaned in hulk. $2.80 sacked. Walter Peirce,R. 2, Hutchinson, Kan.

HELP WANTED—WOMEN
GIRLS—“ Big money, short hours; salary 
while learning; rooms furnished.”  Julian’s 
Beauty School, 910 Main, Kansas City, Mo.

HOME FURNISHINGS & APPLI.

REPAIRS To Fit Furnaces, 
Stov es, Ranees  
<rfall Makes and Kinda 

O r d e r  th ro u g h  y o u r  D E A L E R  
METZNER STOVE REPAIR CO. 

BetebBshad 1 S 8 0  • -  Kansas City 6 ,  M o.

LIVESTOCK
ANGUS HEIFERS. 10 head registered. 

Good quality.
L. B. Goodin & Son, R. No. 2, Derby, Kan.

INSTRUCTION
EDUCATIONAL SERVICE 

for the physically unable to attend school. 
Write P. O. Box 442, Washington, D. C.

REAL ESTATE—BUS. PROP.
FOR SALE—GARAGE BUILDING 

Brick construction, 50x100 feet with 2 
adjacent lots, located Almena. Kans.; ex­
cellent business opportunity: $4,000.
MAX THOMPSON Almena, Kansas.

SEEDS, PLANTS, ETC.
FOR SALE: EARLY TRIUMPH SEED 
WHEAT. High yielding, fast growing, 
early maturing. Germination 98%, purity 
89.56%. Price $2.50 per bushel load lots. 

You will find no purer strain. 
CECIL H, WERNEKE 

Caldwell - Kansas.

Buy U. S. Savings Bonds!

JUST A  
DASH IN FEATHERS
OR S P R E A D  O N  ROOSTS

change to CALOX
for the t&fuc 

on your smile
Efficient Calox works two ways:
1 Helps remove film. . .  bring out 

all the natural lustre o f  your 
smile.

2  A special ingredient in Calox 
encourages regular massage. . .  
which has a tonic effect on gums 
. . .  helps make them firm and 
rosy. Tone up your smile...with 
C^ox!

Made i» Jamous McKesson laboratories, 
113 years of pharmaceutical know-bow

AREVOUPAUW fA O m
due to MONTHLY LOSSES?

You girls and women who lose sc 
much during monthly periods that 
you’re pale, weak, “ dragged out" 
this may be due to lack of blood-iron 
Bo try Lydia E. Pinkham’s TABLETS 
— one of the best home ways tc 
build up red blood—in such cases 
Pinkham’s Tablets are one of the 
best blood-iron tonics you can buy*

Doc Blanchard

Re d  BLAIK’S brilliant Army 
football team is on the march 

again. With a record of 18 consecu­
tive victories picked up in 1944 and 
1945, Army’s first 
team should carry 
it through another 
big year, even if its 
spotless record so 
far happens to be 
dented before De­
cem ber arrives.

At least no one 
should expect .any 
further wild romp- 
in  g o v e r  such 
teams as Notre 
Dame, Michigan,
Duke, Cornell, Co­
lumbia, Pennsylvania and Navy.

“ Our first line strength is ex­
tremely good,’ ’ Red Blaik tells you, 
as he looks over his eager talent— 
talent that includes such backfield 
stars as Blanchard, Davis, McWil­
liams and Tucker. “ But we are no 
longer three deep. We are no long­
er even two deep. In addition to 
our starting backfield, which will 
match any in football, we have Fu-’ 
son at center, Poole and Foldberg 
at ends and two good guards.’ ’

As good as Blanchard and Davis 
are, they are not as likely to steal 
the entire show again from such fine 
haoks as young Tucker at quarter 
and Shorty McWilliams at halfback.

A look at the complete records in 
McWilliams’ case proved the Army 
was entirely blameless in connec­
tion with Coach McKean’s charges 
from Mississippi State. It was Mc­
Williams, hacked up by his fam­
ily, who wanted to come to West 
Point. McWilliams made applica­
tion while still in high school, be­
fore he ever entered Mississippi 
State. Letter after letter has proved 
this.

The trouble started on his home 
furlough when rather luscious finan­
cial inducements, apart from any 
Mississippi State official connection, 
were made. And don’t believe this 
was the only large financial induce­
ment offered a college football play­
er this year.

A Smart Choice
McWilliams elected to stay at 

West Point of his own free wiU. It 
was a smart move in his case, as 
too many leaving service football 
have come under the gossip of duck 
ing the draft, whether or not the 
charges are true. I might add that 
his opponents will find the able 
entry from Mississippi is one of 
the best backs in football. He is a 
great kid with unusual ability. And 
if there is a better quarterback in 
college football than young Tucker, 
or a much better passer, I’d like 
to have his name.

This year of 1946 may be the last 
season in some time that Army can 
field any winning team.

For one reason, too many colleges 
are paying good football players 
money that West Point and Annapo­
lis won’t and have no desire to 
meet. For - another reason, too 
many young men have no yearn­
ing to get up at 5 a. m. and work 
16 hours a day.

It is my belief that college pay- 
checks are going to lead to a na­
tional scandal unless there Is a sud­
den check. The fight for young 
stars, plus inducements offered, al­
ready have broken all past records.

Athletic scholarshijls and jobs 
that can take a young fellow through 
college, are O. K. But not the 
substantial paycheck on the side, 
usually handled by keyed-up alumni.

Back again to this 1946 Army 
squad—

In my opinion Army will have the 
best backfield in college football— 
Blanchard, Davis, McWilliams and 
Tucker—power, speed, smartness 
and spirit. Once again, keep a 
more open eye on McWilliams and 
Tucker.

Tough Year for Army
“ This is the hardest year we’ve 

known since 1943,’ ’ Blaik says.
“ Frank Lahey at Notre Dame is 

three deep with a fiock of veterans 
who range back to his great team 
of 1943. Many have picked Notre 
Dame as the best team in football. 
It may be Pennsylvania will give 
us all the trouble we can handle. 
Navy had some hard luck in losing 
men, but Tom HamiUen will do a 
fine job with a squad that will give 
anyone a battle.

“ Few men on our squad,’ ’ Red 
added, “ have ever known defeat. 
They love football. They are all 
fine officer material, and that is 
what West Point is supposed to turn 
out. We can be beaten and we may 
be beaten, but unless we are 
handicapped by injuries to key men, 
it will take quite a team to turn 
the trick.’ ’

At this point. Athletic Director 
Colonel Biff Jones was gazing mood­
ily into the autumn sky.

“ I was just thinking,’ ’ he said, 
“ that if we had enough parking 
space for the human body, we could 
play to at least 300,000 in the Michi­
gan game, and over 800,000 in the 
Notre Dame and Navy games. We 
might do 300,000 in the Pennsylvania 
game.

“ You don’t think so? Come along 
to my office and see the ticket re­
quests already piled up. There were 
over 110,000 applications for the 
Michigan game early in June.

*Cet O'SuUmn SOUS as weli as 
Heels next time you hm  your 
shoes repaired.

you CAN WAL/C 
FARTHER

WITHOUT TIRm.̂ '̂

WE PAY3% ON SAVINGS
T tIC

C l I I L D I N G , ; AND LOAN

ASSOCIATION
Chartered and supervised by the State o f  
Kansas. W e invite your investment with 
us. D o business by mail. Send ns your 
check for amount you want to invest. 
Our certificate sent you by return mafi.
The American Building & Lean Association 

Security Notional Bank Bldg.
Kansas City 10, Kansas

Yodora checks
perspir^ion odor

u ra y
Made on a  Jace cream base. Yodora is 
actually soothing to normal skins. 
Entirely free from irritating salts. 
Can be used right after under-arm 
shaving.
Stays soft and creamy, indefinitely. 
Never gets stiff or grainy.
No harsh chemicals to spoil clothing. 
Tibes or jars, 10^, 30^, 60^
Yes, Yodora is a geode deodorant. 
Tty it—/eel the wonderful difference!

McKesson & Robbins, tnc« 
Bridgeport, Conn.

R A Y O N
PARACHUTES

Beautiful new army surplus para­
chutes measuring 24 feet in diame­
ter—approximately 45 yards of fin­
est quality heavy rayon! 24 triangu­
lar panels llVs feet deep, 32 inches 
across base, with no cross seams! 
Easy to bleach and dye! No shroud lines or cumbersome hardware! 
Your choice of four lovely colors; 
Aqua Blue, Royal Chinese Yellow, 
Sherwood Green or Brilliant Red! 
These ’chutes are wonderful for 
making dresses, blouses, dickeys, 
sportswear and play clothes, chil­
dren’s clothes, curtains, bedspreads, 
pillow covers, slips, scarfs, dozens 
of other things!

ONLY PER’CHUTE
(add $1.00 each for postage and 
handling)—send check, money or­
der, or order C. O. D. Immediate 
delivery — satisfaction guaranteed 
or your nioney back!

HUGH CLAY PAULK
Dept. W

813 No. Kansas Ave., Topeka, Kans.

WNU—H 39—46

For You To Feel Well
24 hours every day, 7 days every 

week, never stopping, the kidneys filter 
waste matter from the biood.

If more people were aware of how the 
kidneys must constantly remove sur­
plus fluid, excess acids and other waste 
matter that cannot stay in the blood 
without injury to health, there would 
be better understanding of why the 
whole system is upset when kidneys fail 
to function properly.

Burning, scanty or too frequent urina­
tion sometimes warns that something 
is wrong. You may suffer nagging back­
ache, headaches, dizziness, rheumatic 
pains, getting up at nights, swelling.

Why not try Doan’s Pills! You will 
be using a medicine recommended the 
country over. Doan’s stimulate the func­
tion of the kidneys and help them to 
flush out poisonous waste from the 
blood. They contain nothing harmful 
Get Doan’ s today. Use with confidence. 
At all drug stores.
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UNIFORM INTERNATIONAL

SUNDAYIcHooL Lesson
By HAROLD L. LUNDQUIST, D. D.

Of The Moody Bible Institute of Chicago. 
Released by Western Newspaper Union.

Lesson for September 29
Lesson subjects and Scripture texts se­

lected and copyrighted by International 
Council of Religious Education; used by 
permission.

JESUS AND THE LAW OF LOVE

LESSON TEXT—Psalm 119:33-38; Mat­
thew 5:43-48.

MEMORY SELECTION—Love worketh no 
ill to his neighbor: therefore love is the ful­
filling of the law.—Romans 13:10.

Love fulfilled the law—in Christ. 
God so loved the world that he gave 
his only begotten Son (John 3:16). 
The law of love is therefore appro­
priate as the subject of our closing 
lesson on the general theme, “ Jesus 
Interprets Old Tetsament Laws.”

Love is the heavenly gift of God, 
who is love, to man who so much 
needs its grace and power for his 
own life and for his living with 
others.

I. The Mind of Love (Ps. 119:33- 
35).

Eight times ih this psalm there 
is found the cry of verse 33 for in­
struction in the laws of God. Man 
not only must know them, but he 
must know how they operate. The 
picture here is that of a man who 
wants to get in step with God, 
marching out to spiritual warfare 
and being prepared to respond in 
prompt obedience to the commands 
of his divine leader.

Here we have the true mind of 
love. The one rightly instructed in 
the principles of God’s rule in the 
world sees that love is the basic re­
quirement, but that it expresses It­
self in a life that is in accord with 
the will of God.

The thought of this passage is well 
expressed by Dr. W. R. White: “ The 
psalmist had the highest possible 
conception of love before the revela­
tion in Christ. He saw it as the 
basic order of things. He conceived 
it as identical with the will of Gqd. 
He viewed it as the safe, happy path 
for man. He considered it as the 
way of wisdom. He passionately 
desired to embrace it and order his 
life byVit. He saw it imparting 
to the naive and simple the benefits 
of extraordinary judgment. To 
measure up he knew that he had to 
be quickened or made alive to it by 
the power of God.”

II. The Manner of Love (Ps. 119: 
36-38).

Love operates hot from necessity, 
but because of an inner urge which 
will not be denied. The lisalmist 
prays that his heart may be so in­
clined toward the Lord and so 
quickened within that he may be 
eager to do the will of God.

Love has a technique, if you will, 
a manner of operation. It avoids 
certain things which would hinder 
or prevent its full function and 
seeks out those attitudes and ex­
periences which will encourage and 
enlarge.

Covetousness must be avoided, for 
that is idolatry (Col. 3:5). We noted 
in our lesson of two weeks ago 
that covetousness makes a man 
stingy, envious, selfish, proud and 
foolish. That means that love must 
rule out this destructive element. 
Love cannot live in such an atmos­
phere.

Love turns away from vanity. The 
vain things of this world are usually 
presented in such attractive dress 
that to took at them is to be tempt­
ed. The answer is to turn your 
eyes away, or better still, ask God 
to give you special grace not only 
to turn away, but to stay turned 
away. The vain passions of this 
world destroy real love, even while 
using the word to describe their 
base counterfeit.

The positive side of the matter is 
also clear. The manner in which 
love best expresses itself is in the 
fear of God, in the established order 
of a life according to the law of 
God (v. 38). By being inclined to 
his testimonies it finds the right 
way—God’s way (v. 37). ,

III. The Measure of Love (Matt. 
5:43-48).

How far does love go? Does it 
have a limit? Does it choose those 
toward whom it will express itself, 
loving the lovely and ignoring or 
hating the rest? In answer to these 
questions let us first ask. What is 
the general attitude of the world? 
The answer is evident. The world 
has established its own principle of 
conduct based on selfish advantage. 
It pays to be polite to those who 
can favor you, so cultivate their 
good will by acts of courtesy and 
kindness. Your neighbor may be 
able to help you in an hour of need, 
so do good to him as you have op­
portunity.

But an enemy—what can you gain 
from kindness to him? Hate him, 
and treat him like an enemy.

Christianity knows nothing of such 
a spiiit. Even though it be neces­
sary to oppose wicked men in order 
to hinder their evil plans, we need 
not lose our love for them. Even 
those who despitefully use us may 
be loved for Christ’s sake.

“ Consider him that endured such 
contradiction of sinners against 
himself (and went right on loving 
them) lest ye be wearied”  in your 
own love for those who bear the sad 
name of enemies (see Heb. 12:3).

This is admittedly a high stand­
ard, but it is not too high for those 
who know the love of Christ.

^^RI G H T jr o m  fAe S l a r f "

★
★
it
★

ic

★
★

Y o u r  H o m e  is W A R M  
e v e r y  M O R N I N G

N am e Ro9'- - |^ j | | |^  in U . S. and  C an  Pat. O ff.

; : C O A L  H E A T E R

M ODEL 520

Start a fire but once a year. . .  Heats 
all day and all night without refuel* 
ing! Amazing, patented interior con* 
struction* Provides an abundance o f 
clean, steady heat for the average 
hom e. *. at low cost. Holds 100 Ihs. 
o f  coal* Burns any kind o f  coal, coke, 
briquets or wood. Requires less at* 

tention than most furnaces. More 
’ic than a million now

in use!

*  ★  ★  ★  ★
U. S . Pat. Nos. 2.255,527 and 127.471 and 
Can.'Pat. No. 401,088. Name Beg; U . S. 
and Can. Pat. Off.

WARlfllORNING

LOCKE STOVE COMPANY
m  W. l l t h  SL. Kansas City 6, Mo.
Model 420A baa built-in Antomatie D raft 
Regulator. Ask your dealer about tbe 
new D raft Regulator fo r  Models 620 
and 120 available at low  cost. M ODEL 420 A

yjouA. ChMhaiti, Sducaiim,—
H u i}, I L . S -. S cu tin g A , H o n d i,!

^ / 7t o / v m £ 7r pm
¥ o £ y o u £ 7V /v< yr/£

\\
Sample its grand rich flavor—enjoy 

its tongue-gentleness—and you too 
will say, PRIN CE A LBERT!

/A / /I d /
//is/i£(/di/s

r/jsr/7VS/icco m r / s

PACKS BETTER 
IN PIPES

/

•  “The first pipeful sold me on Prince Albert,”  says Mr. L. 
C. Davis, above. “ P. A. is a real comfort smoke—mild, good­
tasting to the bottom of the bowl. Packs better—draws right.’*

•  “ Crimp cut Prince Albert sure rolls up fast 
and neat,”  says Mr. W. M . Miller, below. /  
“ Smokes tasty too—cool and mild.”

Se J. SeynoldsTobacco Company, Wintton-Salom.
N C .
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LOCAL NEWS ed to Lubbock with 
Monday.

Mr. Veazey

Miss Elsie Pearle Spurlock and 
Harry Chamberland visited in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Herbert F ol-' 
som Saturday afternoon.

Mrs. Jack Veazey and daugh­
ter, Lubbock, who have been visit­
ing in the home of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. F. B. Mullins, return-

A. L. Cooper, Big Spring, spent 
the week end with Mr. and Mrs. H. 
J. Cooper.

Mr. and Mrs. A. 
Texhoma, visited 
Sunday evening.

H. Dawson, 
relatives here

Mrs. F. L. Yates was a business

Bottle Gas
Exchange

it 1!Just Received

RCA B A TTE R Y RADIOS  

PLASTIC CLOTHES LINES 

CARPET SWEEPERS 

GAS HEATERS

RECORDS, RECORD PLAYERS AND  
RECORD CABINETS

SOLID CEDAR AND W A LN U T  
CEDAR CHESTS  

You Will-Want One O f These.
FLOOR AND TABLE LAMPS  

Numerous Other Items 
IF IT IS AN YTH IN G  FOR THE  

HOME, W E SHOULD H A V E  IT  
IF IT IS AVAILAB LE

Use Our Low Rate Installment Plan 
Pay As You Use It

LIBERAL TRADE-IN ALLOW ANCES
. See Us Before You Buy and Be Sat­

isfied ■ It is What W e Say It Is.

Slay’s Furniture
Kelvinator

Notice
Now is the time to change that Sum­

mer Oil to Winter Grade.

Let us Flush Out your Motor and 
Radiator before cold weather arrives.

Just Received:
CAR BATTERIES And RADIO  

FARM  BATTERIES

T E X A C O  GAS And OILS

Walden Electric Co.
Phone 111

lance Friday.

visitor in Amarillo Monday.

Lewis James transacted business 
in Amarillo Monday.

Chester Plunk and C T. Watson 
were business visitors in Amarillo 
Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. T. L. Taylor and

daughter, Patricia, spent the week 
end in Hugo, Colorado.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth Eller, E. J. 
Massie, Demus Eller, W. P. Fore­
man, Dan Foreman, A. C. Witt, 
John Knight and Harry Ingham, 
are among those fishing at Eagle 
Nest Lake this week.

Grain
Buying and Selling
You will always find us ready to be of service in your 

dealings with grain whether you wish to buy or sell, and we 
appreciate your business. ^

------DEALERS I N -------
GRAIN, COAL, FEED, SEED “  

And DEMPSTER DRILLS

Phones 40 and 86

Stratford Grain Co.
The Stratford Star

Published Weekly By 
Brown Ross

Entered as second class matter 
at the Post Offi-ce in Stratford, 
Texas, under the act of March 3, 
1879.

Subscription Rates
$2.00 per year in Sherman and 

adjoining counties. $2.50 per year 
outside first zone.

Byron Fedric, Claude Fedric, J. 
B. Stubblefield, Glenn Reed, and 
Conde Donelson attended the gov­
ernment surplus commodity sale in 
Amarillo Monday.

W. T. Martin and W. C. Martin 
left Tuesday for a fishing trip at 
Eagle Nest, New Mexico.

Mr. and Mrs. Archie Arnold and 
Mr. and-Mrs. Howard Etheridge re­
turned Sunday from a visit to 
Eagle Nest lake.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Milton re­
turned Monday from a visit in the 
Rio Grande valley.

Mr. and Mrs. Delbert Cummings 
were business visitors in Oklahoma 
City Monday.

Mechanical ❖

Repair Service
f o r --------

CARS
PICK-UPS
TRUCKS
TRACTORS

Experienced Mechanics who guar­
antee satisfactory repair service are in 
our shop at all times to furnish the repair 
service which you desire.

TOC Motbr Co.
Studebaker Sales and Service
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School Girl’s Specials 
PLAID And PLAIN

Wool Skirts
Sizes 8 to 16

SW E A T E R S ,
ALL COLORS AND SIZES

SLACK SUITS
Sizes 10 to 18 ‘

❖
❖

❖

❖❖

❖

DRESSES 
In Assorted Colors

Sizes 7 to 14

Classified and Legals
10 cents per line per insertion; 

IVz cents per line subsequen'i; in­
sertions. Display rates on appli­
cation.

LOCAL NEW S
Van B. Boston and R. C. Buckles 

attended the Kansas state fair at 
Hutchison Thursday and a hearing 
of the inter-state commerce com­
mission at Wichita Friday, after 
which they returned home.

Miss Dorothy Dixon, Sherman 
County Home Demonstration 
Agent, attended a landscape train­
ing school in Amarillo Thursday 
and Friday which was conducted 
by Miss Sadie Hatfield, A. & M. 
Landscape specialist.

SLIPS, PANTIES And ANKLETS
IN ALL SIZES

Come In For Your School Supplies

Ross Bros. Dry Goods

LeVs

Make 

A Date

Leslie Parker, Lgo Smith, and 
Claude Sloan left Wednesday for a 
deer, elk, and bear hunting trip 
near Glacier Park, Montana.

Mrs. M. R. Robinson was taken 
to Canyon in the Wilson ambu-

Roxy Theatre
STRATFORD, TEXAS

September 26 and 27

‘ ‘Souls At Sea’^
September 28

“ Saddle Serenade’’
Jimmy Wakely and Lee White

September 29 and 30

“ Ziegfield Follies 
Of 1946”

u

Brown's Food Store
October 1 and 2

They Made Me A  
Killer”

With Robert Lowery and Barbara 
Britton

Call u? up soon, and let’s set a day for overhauling 
your tractor and other farm equipment.

W aitin g  ’til the last minute is mighty dangerous 

business that might lead to delays next season.

[N ow ’s the time to  get your nam e on  ou r advance 
service schedule.

M c C O R M I C K - D E E R I N G  M A C H I N E S
P A R T S  AND S E R V I C E

W. T. MARTIN
H A R D W A R E  — I M P L E M E N T S  

A N D  F U R N I T U R E


