
Weather
June 13 95 60 
June 14 96 60 
June 15 91 60 
June 16 91 59

*01. 71, No. 24

Muleshoe Journal
klh e  Community (Jj Opportunity- H here Haler Makes The Difference

Published Every Thursday At Muleshoe, Bailey County, Texas 79347 T E X A S  P#IESS 
ASSO CIATIO N

Thursday, June 17,1993

Big July Fourth Celebration Planned
Stanfield, Stegall, Prater Kicks Off The Entertainment

An enthralling line up of 
entertainment is scheduled for the 
big July 4th Celebration here in 
Muleshoe. To kick off the 
festivities Jana Springfield will 
highlight entertainment at Joe 
Rhodes Boot Shop on July 1st. 

following will be Red Stegall on 
July 3rd and Colt Prather on July 
5th.

Ms. Stanfield's songs of love and 
life have been recorded by artists as 
diverse as Andy Williams and Rcba 
Mclntire. With all this success, she 
looks back fondly on the days when 
she gathered up her dreams and 

amoved to Nashville.
"At first I thought I'd get a job as 

a songwriter," she says. "I tied 
every place that was hiring 
songwriters...Burger King, Dairy 
Queen, Wendy's..."

Things have picked up 
considerably since those early days. 
She has been featured on the 
Nashville Network, and her debut 
{ Ibum has just been released. Each 
song on the album showcases the 
power, clarity and range of Jana's 
captivating voice.

Ms. Stanfield's talents and 
interests are as diverse as her 
music. No stranger to the 
limelight, Jana first supported her 
music habit as a television news 
reporter in her home state of New 
^texico. In Nashville, she does 
regular television features about the 
area's most interesting people and 
places for a PBS show called 
"Tennessee Crossroads." She is the

host of a radio comedy show called 
"The Bones Alternative Theater," 
and has dabbled in stand-up 
comedy. "Just in case the need 
arises." she says, "I also know how 
to buck-dance."

Jana's ability to use words and 
music to share her infectious 
enthusiasm about life keeps her in 
demand as a speaker and performer.. 
Whether it's in a concert hall, a 
coffeehouse, or a church, Jana uses 
her music, her insight and her sense

ofof humor to touch the heart 
anyone who’s willing to listen.

The entertainment career of Red 
Steagall has covered a period of 25 
years and has spanned the globe 
from Australia to the Middle East. 
He lias performed for heads of state 
including a special party for 
President Reagan at the White 
House in 1983, and for government 
officials in eight Middle Eastern 
countries. As a native Texan, 
Steagall enjoyed a career in

Agricultural Chemistry after 
graduating from West Texas 
State University with a degree in 
Animal Science and Agronomy.

He spent eight years as a music 
industry executive in Hollywood, 
Calif, and has spent the last 12 
years as a recording artist, song­
writer. and television and motion 
picture personality.

His office is currently outside of 
Fort Worth, where in addition to 
his entertainment activities, he is

RED STEAGALL JANA STANFIELD

currently involved in the production 
of motion pictures and television 
shows.

Although Steagall is best known 
for his Texas Swing dance music 
and such songs as "Here We Go 
Again", "Party Dolls and Wine", 
"Freckles Brown", and "Lone Star 
Beer and Bob Wills Music."

If you ask him where his favorite 
place to play music is, Steagall 
might say some famous stage in 
Nashville, California, Spain, or 
Germany—or he might say some 
lonesome cow camp in West 
Texas.

He has had over 200 of his 
compositions recorded both by 
himself and other artists. Steagall 
also wrote the title song to the 
National Finals Rodeo telecast 
along with songs written for the 
following movies: Vanishing 

Point; Drive-In; Shadows on the 
Wall; Savannah Smiles, and Dark 
Before Dawn.

He has produced 26 consecutive 
records on the national charts and 
released a total of thirteen albums.

Each year, Steagall has averaged 
performing 200 days, for the past 
15 years, including over 100 major 
rodeo performances and an equal. 
number of major fair appearances.

He has completed tours of 
Germany, Spain, Australia, the 
Middle East, and South America.

Steagall represented the United 
States government twice; on a tour 
of eight countries on the Middle 
East in the spring of 1986. and a

tour of South American countries 
in the spring of 1991.

He has appeared on stage at 
several hotels.

As a television personality, he is 
a regular on NBC series, Music 
Country USA; host of two 
television pilots, (which he 
produced); numerous appearances 
on syndicated television shows 
such as Hee Haw and Nashville on 
the Road; four years host of the 
national televised National Finals 
Rodeo; host of the Winston Pro 
Tour on ESPN for the 1985 
season; four years co-executive 
producer of the Academy of 
Country Music Awards Show: 
numerous television and radio 
commercials.

He had a major role in the 
motion picture Henji The Hunted 
which was released in the summer 
of 1987. He also had a role in the 
motion picture. Dark Before Dawn.

Steagall is a member of the 
Board of Trustees of the Pro Rodeo 
Hall of Champions; Honorary 
Member of the Cowboy Artists of 
America; former Chairman of the 
Board of The academy of Country 
Music.

He produced the motion picture 
Big Bad John, starring Jimmy 
Dean, Jack Elam, Ned Beatty, Bo 
Hopkins, and directed by Burt 
Kennedy.

Steagall has been the co-host of 
the College National Finals Rodeo 
for the Freedom Sports Network
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, Earth's Fourty-Ninth 
Annual Rodeo Date Set

Festivities for the 49th annual 
Earth Rodeo will begin with a 
parade at 6:30 p.m. Friday, June 
18. A $100 prize will be given to 
fhe first place winner in the 
Business Boats. Second place will 
receive $50 and third place $25.

Following the parade, the area 
Lions Clubs will sponsor a 
Hamburger Supper at the arena.

Show time begins at 8:30 p.m. 
both Friday and Saturday night. 
Admission will be $5 for adults and 
$3 for students, under 12.
1 A Rodeo Dance will be held each 
night. Admission will be $5 or $3 
with a Rodeo Ticket.

Entries will be taken from noon 
until 6 p.m. on June 15. Entrants 
under the age of 18 must have their 
parents signed consent. According 
to information released by the 
Rodeo Officials, The Earth Roping 

rClub or Rodeo Producer will not be 
responsible for any accident or 
property damage which may occur.

Added to this year's entertainment 
will be a Wild Cow Milking 
Contest. For entries call (806) 257- 
2252. Buckles will be awarded to

the winning team.
There will also be a Stick Horse 

Race, for children six and under. 
Entrants need to take their own 
stick horse.

TCRA approved contestants 
Jackpot One Go-Around will 
include: Calf Roping, with a fee of 
$60: Bareback Riding (open). $60: 
Saddle Bronc Riding (open), $60; 
Girl's Barrel Race, S60; Bull 
Riding (open). $60; and Team 
Roping, roper's choice, $ 100.

Enter two times. Girl's Break- 
Away Roping, $60, Slack will be 
Friday night after the show.

Added events this year will 
include Novice Bareback, $30; 
Novice Saddlcbronc Riding. $30; 
and Novice Bull Riding, $30.

Two 20X Bailey hats (pastel 
colors available) donated by Joe's 
Boot Shop in Muleshoe will be 
given away. One hat will be drawn 
/o r  each night. The ticket stub 
from the gate makes you eligible 
for the drawing.

A Trophy Buckle will be 
awarded to first place winners in 
TCRA events.

Rodeo stock will be furnished by 
C-T Rodeo of Lubbock.

If you enjoy rodeos, fun and 
excitement, the Earth Roping 
Arena is the place you want to be 
on Friday and Saturday night, June 
18 and 19.

Barbecue Grill 
To Be Given 

Away July 4th
MASH and Meals On Wheels 

will be giving away a Barbecue 
Grill on July 4. The grill was 
donated by J.C. Gatewood.

For every one dollar donation 
you will be given a chance to win 
this grill.

You may make your donation at 
Joe's Boot Shop, where the grill is 
on display; Muleshoe State Bank, 
F irs t B ank, Poynors, 
Highinbothams, and Western Drug.

Tickets will be available, 
tomorrow, Friday.

According to Sharon Grant, you 
do not have to be present to win.

GIRLS UKE TOYS TOO-—That is what these three girls seemed to think Saturday as they examined the toys at 
the Toy Show Saturday. Shani Rasco, and Jenna Rasco arc the daughters of Wesley and Dana Rasco of Muleshoe 
and Krista Rasco is the daught <J Darcll and Marva Rasco of Lockney. (Journal Photo)

Women Leading-

ing" will be the theme of an ail day 
Regional Seminar Saturday, June 
26 sponsored by the Muleshoe 
Jennyslippcrs, Women Associates 
of the Chamnber of Commote and 
Agriculture.
All area women are encouraged to 

attend.
The fun filled informative day will 

begin with registration at9 a.m. with 
the program beginning at 10, in the 
Bailey County Coliseum.
Dan Henson, president of R.C. and 

D. (Resource Conservation and 
Development Funding) will be the 
speaker for the morning session.
Following a salad luncheon, there 

will be a mini-seminar on Women 
Doing Investment Banning.

There will be door prizes, enter­
tainment and demonstrations.

For more information you may 
contact Nancy Kidd or Billy Down­
ing.

Rotary Club 
Views Film 
On Dallas
Cowboys

Charles Marow was in charge of 
the Rotary Club at noon Tuesday, 
in the absence of their president, 
David Tipps.

Visitors were welcomed and the 
program was turned over to Bob 
Finney.

Finney showed a film of cuts 
and highlights of various Dallas 
Cowboys football games on their 
way to the National Cham­
pionship.

In 1981 the Cowboys only won 
one of 16 games and two seasons 
later, in 1992, after a lot of 
trading, the Cowboys were one of 
the youngest teams in the UFL. 
According to the film they were 
probably the most talented.

The 1992 Championship was the 
first title they had received since 
1985.

This was the first time that the 
Dallas Cowboys had won the 
championship in ten years.

Following the film the meeting 
was adjourned.

Women Doing 
Seminar Set

"Women Leading.-Women D

W alkathon-Biker  
Prize Giveaway

Walkathon Prize Giveaway was 
held Saturday, June 5, 1993 at 
10:00 a.m. at the Courthouse 
parking lot.Results are: Marcy 
Jaramilio (adult) prize received- 
AMFM Realistic portable cassette 
stereo jam box; Billie Downing 
(adult) prize received-$25.00 gift 
certificate; Chasity Spencer, 
daughter of Sandra Bricker, 1st 
grade prize received-2 pair of roller 
skates; Lauren Edler, daughter of 
Kim Humphrey, kindergarten prize 
roller skates and soccerball; Gabriel 
Villegas, 6th grade prize-2 
soccarballs and 1 football; Theral 
Edler, son of Kim Humphrey, 1st 
grade prize-roller skates and 
football; Andy Sain, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Tim Sain, 1st grade prize- 
roller skates; Chris Vaughn, son of 
Darla Stovall, 5th grade prize- 
football.

Additional participants were 
Shauna Dale, Ruth Hall, Can Kidd, 
Cassie Height, Kimberly Villa, 
Larry Wauson, Reynaldo Ortiz, Jr., 
Saioman Esparza, Adam Romas, 
Hubert Kidd, Nancy Kidd, and 
Dusty Kidd ($10. gift certificate).

All participants received a 
colorful Walkathon Visor and a 
Biker’s Water Bottle.

A net total of $670.00 was 
received to be given to the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Commerce 
and Agriculture to help defray the 
cost of Fireworks for the 4th of 
July. The Jennyslippers sincerely 
appreciate all who helped in any 
way—whether walking, riding a 
bike, or donating to the 
participants. We'U have a "bang- 
up” Muleshoe 4th of July!! Thanks
Corn. Page 6, Col. 1

MISD Hires New T ea ch ers
During Monday night's school 

board meeting, the board hired four 
new teachers, Judy Stokes, who 
will be teaching Special Education 
at Watson Junior High; Deborah 
Wood and Shelley Chester, at 
Dillman; and Kerry Finney, high 
school science.

Cindy Purdy, president, called the 
meeting to order and the minutes of 
the May 24 meeting were approved 
as distributed.

A discussion was held on the 
summer construction projects and a 
report given by the architect.

Make A Wish 
Softball 
Tournament Set

A Softball Tournament is 
scheduled July 2-5 at the New City 
Park, with all proceeds going to 
The Make A Wish Foundation.

The Make A Wish Foundation 
grants wishes to sick children 
between the ages of 5 and 18 yeare.

Entry fee is $120 per team. The 
deadline for entering is June 25.

Trophies will be awarded first, 
second and third place winners in
the Men's League, Class D&E and 
Mixed League.

If you would like to umpire these 
games or for more information you 
arc asked to contact Robert Orozco 
at 272-3867 or Shorty Bores at 
272-3060 after 6 p.m.

Bids for the District Depository 
Contract were opened and the 
contract was awarded to First Bank. 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 1

Shoot-O ut
B asketball

F estival
The Lazbuddic Yearbook Staff 

will host a Big Shoot-Out, 3 On 3 
Basketball Festival on June 18 and 
19 at the Lazbuddie ISD Gym­
nasiums.

Brackets, game times and game 
rules will be mailed on Tuesday, 
June 14. If there are sufficient 
entries, three games per team will 
be guaranteed.

Entries by school grade levels, 
beginning with fifth grade and 
under and continuing through those 
having completed high Khool and 
college will be accepted.

Boys and girls, men and women 
teams may enter.

Entry fees are $10 per person on 
each team entered. There will be an 
additional $2 fee to enter the free 
throw or 3-pointer contests.

The deadline for registration will 
be Monday, June 14. You may 
send your registration along with a 
check or money order to Lazbuddic 
Yearbook Staff. Lazbuddie I.S.D., 
Drawer A. lazbuddie, Texas 79053.

For more information you may 
call 806-965-2156 or 806 965- 
2183.
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Students Receive Awards--(Back L-R) Nina Maldonado, Jose Mendoza, Computer Math; Lisa Provence, 
Child Development; Adrian Salazar, Careers; Chris Mardis (Middle L-R) Stacie Harris, SCAC; Cathey 
Espinoza.Advanced Child Development; Kristi Chapmanjnterior Design; (Front L-R) Shawna Delaney, 
Computer Applications I; Kristin Chitwood, Library Science; Dora Barrera, HECE; Amelia Flores, 
HERO. (Journal Photo)

Team Approach Sending Stroke 
Survivors Home
An aggressive team approach not 

available a generation ago is 
sending stroke survivors home,1 
where they can often care for 
themselves, says a rehabilitation 

• expert at Baylor College of 
Medicine in Houston.

"Both of my grandfathers died as 
a result of strokes and all the 
families could do for them was let 
them lie on the sofa at home," said 
Dr. Susan J. Garrison, an associate 
professor of physical medicine and 
rehabilitation at Baylor.

There was not much that could 
be done in the 1950's to help 
people like Garrison’s grandfathers. 
Typically, elderly patients were 
institutionalized or required much 
assistance at home from their 
families.

"Our goal today is to make 
stroke survivors as self-sufficient as 
possible," said Garrison, who 
works with stroke survivors.

Garrison becomes involved with 
a patient as soon as the initial 
danger has passed, after physicians 
pinpoint the area of the brain 
damaged by the stroke. Knowing 
this allows the doctor to determine 
which functions might be regained

Ozona Site For 
First Logo Sign 

Unveiling
Tiny Ozona, on Interstate 10 in 

West Texas, will be the site of the 
state's first business logo sign.

The blue signs advertising 
nearby gas stations, restaurants, 
lodging and campgrounds will be 
similar to those in 37 other states.

Texas’ first such signs will be 
unveiled at 9 a.m. June 17 at a 
sited east of Ozona.

The Texas Transportation 
Commission in September 
approved the slate's first logo sign 
for placement along Interstate 
highways in counties with fewer 
than 20,000 people. Interstates 
cross 35 such counties in Texas.

"Not only will the signs raise 
money for Texas transportation, 
they make travel on Interstates 
safer," said Arnold Oliver, 
executive director of the Texas 
Department of Transportation 
(TxDOT). "Too often, travelers 
can't see a business sign until it's 
too late to exit. The logo signs 
will guide motorists well in 
advance."

The logo signs were authorized 
by the Texas Legislature in 1991. 
The contract to erect the signs went 
to Texas Logos. Inc. Businesses 
pay a rental fee to display their 
logos, and TxDOT will receive 5 
percent of these fees.

with therapy.
"Interviews with the patient and 

family members also help us to 
know what type and how much 
function has been lost. It is an 
important step towards getting the 
stroke survivor back into 
mainstream living as quickly as 
possible,” Garrison said.

A physical therapy plan is 
designed to teach patients how to 
use healthy limbs while the affected 
muscles regain strength. A team of 
therapists helps patient regain the, 
use of muscles, limbs, and 
language when speech has been 
affected.

Recovery usually begins with a 
physical therapist manually 
moving the patients' muscles or 
limbs to show them what the 
movement looks and decls like.

A common problem is loss of 
feeling in the arms or legs. It may 
be difficult for patients to tell how 
much, or even when, a limb is 
being moved.

Patients can be taught to know 
what movement feels like through 
the use of functional electrical 
stimulation. A low-voltage current

Frank J. Silhan 
Services Held

Graveside services for Frank J. 
Silhan, 73. of Morton were held 
Tuesday, June 14, 1993 at 
L ittlefie ld  M emorial Park 
Cemetery, with Rev. Clarence 
Tedder, Pastor of Bula Baptist 
Church officiating.

Burial was in Littlefield 
Memorial Park Cemetery, under the 
direction of Ellis Funeral Home, 
Morton.

Silhan died at 5:05 p.m. June 12, 
1993 at Morton Manor Nursing 
Home.

He was born March 11, 1920 in 
Weinhert, TX. He married Lucy 
"Joyce" Joyce Whitley on Sept. 27, 
1952 in Littlefield. TX. She died 
in 1987.

Mr. Silhan had been a resident of 
Morton, Texas since 1920, moving 
here from Weinert, TX. He was a 
farmer and member of Littlefield 
Baptist Church.

A brother Felix Silhan preceded 
him in death in 1987.

Survivors include two sons, 
Robert Silhan of Littlefield, TX 
and Larry Silhan of Houston, TX; 
two daughters, Debra Lamar of 
Morton, TX and Kari Runyan of 
NY; four brothers, Eddie Silhan and 
Johnny Silhan, both of Morton, 
George Silhan of Seguin, TX, and 
Benny Silhan of Pep, TX; two 
sisters. Martha Fain of Austin, TX 
and Ella Marek of Littlefield, TX; 
and eleven grandchildren.
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stimulates the muscle so the 
patient will learn what it feels like 
when the limb moves. This helps 
determine the amount of effort 
necessary to walk or move an arm 
or wrist for instance.

"It takes an enormous amount of 
exercise and determination on the 
part of the patients," Garrison said. 
"There is frequently pain and 
soreness from moving muscles and 
joints in ways they have never been 
moved before."

"Anybody who has experienced 
soreness and pain from exercise can 
imagine what a stroke survivor 
must go through, only magnify the 
work and the pain several times 
over," she said.

As dexterity is regained in 
affected joints and limbs, an 
occupational therapist helps 
patients relearn certain basic 
functions.

"This means learning new skills, 
such as using another hand to eat, 
or even just using other fingers on 
the same hand to hold a knife or 
fork, it may involve relearning 
how to move arms and legs as 
strength returns," Garrison said.

Speech therapists can teach 
stroke survivors how to make the 
most of speaking abilities. Simple 
things like making a vowel sound 
may be difficult depending on what 
muscles in the neck and head areas 
have been affected.

"Therapists, nurses, doctors and 
family members with a positive 
attitude can send stroke survivors 
home with basic skills and the 
confidence to care for themselves," 
Ganison said.

Services For 
Holly Saylor 
Held Monday

Services for Holly Saylor, 14, of 
Canyon were held at 2:00 p.m. 
Monday, June 14, 1993 at the First 
United Methodist Church in 
Muleshoe, with Rev. Richard 
Edwards and Dr. James Bell 
officiating.

Burial was in Muleshoe 
Memorial Cemetery, under the 
direction of Ellis Funeral Home, 
Muleshoe.

Miss Saylor died June 11, 1993 
at Northwest Texas Hospital.

She was born August 19, 1978 
tn Clovis, NM.

She was a trainer for Canyon 
High School Athletic Department. 
She was in the Theater Arts and on 
the Honor Roll of Canyon High 
School. She had been selected to 
go to Texas Drug Leader Camp as a 
leader.

Survivors include her parents, 
David Saylor of Farwell, Tx and 
Marilyn Black of Canyon, TX; one 
sister, Julie Saylor of Canyon. TX; 
grandparents Mr. and Mrs. Eugene 
Black of Muleshoe and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jake Saylor of Farwell, TX.

The family suggests memorials 
to DARE-Canyon, TX--Cal 
Farley's Boy's Ranch.

(Patients In 
‘Muleshoe Area 
Medical Center

Governor's 
Conference For 

Volunteer 
Leadership

The Governor’s Office of 
Community Leadership will hold 
the 17th Annual Conference for 
Volunteer Leadership in Austin, 
Texas.

With a new focus on volunteer 
leadership, the Conference will 
provide training and networking 
opportunities for volunteer 
managers, community affairs 
directors and leaders of volunteer 
groups. Workshops will offer nuts 
and bolts skills in. basic programs 
development, leadership training for 
experienced managers, board 
development, communication 
skills, fund raising information, 
corporate volunteer development 
information and presentations on 
current issues in community 
services. Volunteer managers and 
leaders from  nonprofits , 
corporations, public agencies, 
religious organizations, community 
groups, schools and youth 
programs, health care and 
environmental organizations and

volunteer membership groups, are 
encouraged to attend.

The Governor's Awards for 
Volunteer Service will be presented 
at the Awards Luncheon. 
Nominations are being sought for 
individuals, families, groups and 
businesses which have performed 
outstanding volunteer service 
during the past year. Deadline for 
submission on nominations is July 
30, 1993.

Conference registration is 
$55.00 before September 6, 1993 
and $65.00 after. For more

information, a Conference Brochure 
or Awards Applications contact 
Debbie Rash at (512)475-2615.

Ira Magaziner, Clinton health 
aide:

"Some coverage will be phased 
in, not because of money, but v 
find out if  it works."

No excuse is as good 
as a satisfactory perfor­
mance.

Great Gift For Dad 
On Father's Day  *

"Hales derails Of ‘Bailey County'
(Bailey County History Book)

Available Now At:
Muleshoe Public Library 

Heritage House Inn
or Vivian White

JUNE 11, 1993 
Lacie Kirk, Robby Young

JUNE 12, 1993
Mildred Bartley, Lacie Kirk, Robby 
Young

JUNE 13, 1993 
Mildred Bartley. Brady Henley

JUNE 14. 1993
Elizabeth Hudson. Mildred Bartley, 
Mike Fisher. Brady Henley. Sylvia 
Juarez

0>/o OFF
Special Clearance 
Items -  One Of A Kind 
Discontinued, Etc.

- Prices good only on merchandise in stock

Wing Back Chair R eg. $469  95  $2 3 5
Charles

Sofa Sleeper Reg $1395 837
$1 4 2 7 40 

$5 0 9 40

$995
$540Reg $899  9 5  V  “ 1 /

$6 3 0

2 Pc. Country High Back

Living Room Group Reg $1690

Brown Velvet

Love Seat
Charles Custom 72‘

So fa ............................... ...............Reg. $1050

5 Pcs. (Sofa, Love Seat, Chair, 2 Tables) ^  85
Southwest Group Reg $2949  75  1 7 6 9
Queen ASofa Sleeper ..Reg $1099 .95

Mayo Brown Tones .

SOfa ......................................Reg. $799 .95  4 8 0
?LaZ0oy S O  C OSwivel Rockers ..R e g  $429 .95  ea. 25v • •

Regular Size (Irmerspring mattress) *

Sofa Sleeper Reg. $950 .00

1 (With Casters) ^  _  _

Chair......................................... Reg. $2 5 9 .0 0  1 5 9
La-Z-Boy Leather

Reclina-Rockers 4 0  /O OFF

Mayo Queen Size *  _  _

Sleeper Reg $99500 * 5 9 9
Country Victorian *

Sofa/Love Seat Reg $2195  0 0  1 3 2 0
Cherry Trim ^

Sofa/Love S e a t R e g  $1599  90  * 9 6 0
Charles Custom Traditional $ O A / \

Sofa .....................  ..............Reg $1350 .00  O t J U

2 Pc Southwest (Blue) *  .  .  _  _

Soft/Love S e a t p e g  $1895  I I 4 5
Charles Custom (Contemporary With Oak Trim) ^

Sofa/Love S e a t n e g  $2150 1 1 9 0
1 Mauve, 1 Forest Green ^  _  _

Wing Back Chairs Reg $ 3 4 9 9 5  I 9 9

Maple

China Cabinet Reg $23 7 9  00

5 Pcs. (4 Chairs)

Dropleaf Table Reg. $849  00

f t r t F

White and Natural

5 Pc. Dinette
7 Piece

$1
Reg $89 9 .0 0  5 3 9  

Dinette ........... R eg $1249  0 0  * 7 5 0
7 Pc. 48' Round (6 Chairs) ^

Parchment Oak TableReg $1495  00 9 9 6
Serta Mattress & Box Spring

$ O f i Q  $ O Q Q
Reg S ize  \ J  w  Q ueen  S ize  A ■  v r  w  

4 Pc. (Sola, Love Seal, Oversize Chair and Ottoman),

Southwest Group Reg $2295  00

Entertainment Centers 4 0  Oil

R eg $549 .95  '330 Reg $792  *475
(Others To C hoose From)

4 Pe. White Provincial

Bedroom Group Reg $1395  00

nL

*1380

$837

5 Pc. (Tnple Dresser, Chest, 2 Night Stands) _

Pencil Post Bed R eg $3195  00 I 91 7
Red With Twin Overhead (Complete wwaitresses!^ —  r i . Q r

Metal Sofa Bed * 5 3 9
RveM>e $ 2 7 9 9 5Roll Top Desk

o *t f

o *

“Your Quality Furniture Store”

Calton Furniture
507 E. 2nd PORTALES 359-1442

_
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SCAC Molds <E O f
School (Picnic

Perfect Attendance Awards Went to  t nira uraaers: /vnuiony Anguiano, Megan Barrett, Nikki Bond, Juan Cruz,
Nikki Felan, Barbara Garcia, Claudia Garcia, Melissa Garcia, Rosario Garza, Fermin Gonzales, Jose 
Hernandez,Yicna Hernandez, Matthew Lopez, Alma Morales, Jennifer Pacheco, Adam Ramirez, Jed Rank, Maria 
Rodriquez, Kristol Sutelo, Veronica Toscano.

The Student-Community Action 
Club (SCAC) held its traditional 
end of school picnic recently to 
honor prospective 1993-94 
members of the club. This special 
meeting was held May 20, 1993 at 
5:30 p.m. at the Muleshoe Civic 
Center with Mandy Shipman and 
parents acting as hosts. Food for 
his hamnburger cook-out was 
furnished by members of the club.

Those present enjoyed volley-ball 
and the activities before eating the 
hamburgers with all of the 
trimmings.

A business meeting was then 
called by the president Stacie 
Harris. The chaplain. Summer 
Wiley gave the opening prayer 
followed by the secretary Amanda 
Ashford reading the minutes of the 
last meeting. The treasurer, Aida 
Martinez gave the treasurer's report.

Each prospective new member 
was then introduced by each one 
giving his or her name, school 
classification and a favorite interest. 
Prospective members are Holly 
Donaldson, Keetha Glover, Angela 
Crawford, Brooke Garrett, Crystal 
Howe, Tami Latham, Jesus Flores, 
Ryan Clapp, Jenna Glover, Nathan 
Noble, Andy Wilson, Mason 
Conklin, Brian Box, Rebecca 
Warren, Leah Bruns, Andra Lee, 
Brook Sinclair. Chad Montgomery, 
Shawna Delaney, Brenna Wheeler, 
Julie Gilliland, Bryan Field, and 
Crista Trussell.

A report was then given about 
the auction bake sale which the 
club sponsored over Channel 6 and

historic fgute  
66 Summer 

f e s t i v a l
A celebration will be held 

on Saturday and Sunday, 
June 19 and 20,1993 to 

celebrate the Historic route 66 
Summer festival.

(Sat) 10:00 a.m. til— 
(Sun) 1:00 p.m. til— 
Between Georgia and 

Western on Historic 6th Street 
Amarillo, Texas 

A Diamond Raffle, antique 
car show, food, music, 
dancing, arts and crafts 

booths, chili cook-off, and 
auction will be among some 

of the activities.
For more information contact: 

Bobbie Helman 806-373- 
0316 or Jean Taylor, 806- 

373-5473.

Lee Cjreemvood Lo
Cattle (Barons (Ball .

Superstar Lee Greenwood has 
been signed to headline the 1993 
Cattle Barons Ball, co-chairman 
Diane and Bill Lowell have 
announced.

The popular event, which 
benefits the American Cancer 
Society, is scheduled from 7 p.m. 
until 1 a.m. June 19 at the V-8 
Ranch southeast of Lubbock, the 
Lowell's said. The theme for this 
year's bash is "Starry Skies, 
Dazzling Pancers, Southwestern 
Magic."

Baron's tickets, which include a 
private reception and bus service, a 
special gift, preferred seating in the 
Baron's circle, dinner, dancing, and 
entertainment, are $250 each or 
$2000 for a table of eight.

Wrangler tickets are $125 per 
person or $1000 for a table of 
eight. These tickets include bus

Need More Energy 
Want to Lose Weight 

Great Business Opportunity 
Distributors Needed

Polly Chester 
Rt. 1 Box 210 

Sudan, Texas 79371

For more information 

Call 227-2234

service, dinner, dancing and 
entertainment.

Persons throughout West Texas 
and Eastern New Mexico are urged 
to support the major fundraiser for 
the American Cancer Society, the 
Lowell's said in announcing 
Greenwood.

Chartered buses will be departing 
from Plains National Bank at 6:30 
p.m. and will continue at intervals. 
There will be no private parking at 
the ranch.

In addition to the appearance by 
Greenwood, dance music will be 
provided by the Lubbock band, 
"Phoenix”. Hosts are Sam Arnett 
and Jack and Arlette Flygare. 
Jeanne and Dave Knapp are 
assistant co-chairman for the ball.

Greenwood is one of the most 
popular entertainers in America 
today.
"Love's On The Way,” his latest 
Liberty album, contains one of the 
finest collections of songs he has 
ever recorded, says producer Jerry 
Crutchfield.

The album contains a breadth and 
depth of subject matter and his 
featured vocals have never been 
better. The album kicks in with 
"Before I'm Over You" and follows 
with "In Other Words" and "Final 
Touches" to name a few. He also 
has included the pop classic, "Linda

‘Bailey County f a t  
fighter.

She Is fhe Resource 
fo r  teaching ‘The 

fozvn fo  Math.
She 9Tas 9\[o 

"frizzy (fray Stair. 
She Is A  Blend O f Antique, Old and Iti Betzveen 

As ‘Evidenced By 9der lHandicapped Sign!
She Is Creative In (Marriage Obligations 

& ^Merits ^Diamonds 
She lMay Be "young" But ‘WillSoon Be

so
Quess Who!

KMUL radio on May 8. Proceeds 
fre.n this successful venture will be 
used to furnish the little girl's 
bedroom of the Jane's Ranch House 
at the Muleshoe Heritage Center.

It was reported by the Treasurer 
that the club cleared over $ 1200.00 
on the auction. The success of the 
auction bake sale was due to the 
cooperation of the club members, 
parents, and others who furnished 
the delicious baked goods, 
supporters who donated other 
articles to auction, the graciousness 
of the Rennels and Channel 6, and 
KMUL and the community which 
supported SCAC by whole­
heartedly bidding on items offered 
for sale. Club members were 
reminded to express appreciation to 
all who made this such a 
tremendous success. A shopping 
trip will soon be planned to buy 
furniture for the little girl's 
bedroom.

The next order of business was to 
elect officers for the 1993-94 
school year. The following were 
elected:

President: Donna Puckett, Vice- 
President: Kristen Weatherbie, 
Secretary: Emily Harris, Treasurer: 
Shane Schuster, Reporter: Brook 
S in c la ir , P a rliam en tarian :

Stephanie Quintana, Historian: 
Jeanne Cox, Chaplain: Mason 
Conklin.

The sponsors, Barbara Milbum 
and Jean Allison then presented 
each of the outgoing senior officers 
a small gift in recognition of the 
outstanding job he/she did last vear.
Outgoing officers honored were: 
President: Stacie Harris, Vice- 
President: Mandy Shipman, 
Secretary: Amanda Ashford, 
Treasurer Aida Martinez, Reporter: 
Rebecca Green, Parliamentarian: 
Dustin Wilhite, Historian: Jodie 
Thomas, and Chaplain: Summer 
Wiley.

An installations of new officers 
meeting will be held in August. 
The president then adjourned the 
meeting.

W ise W oman
Student-To whom was 

Minerva Married?
Professor—My boy,'

when will you learn 
Minerva was the Goddess 
of Wisdom? She wasn't 
married.

Com petent
Fleet headquarters 

wired a ship at sea: 
"Move heaven and earth: 
get there Friday!"

The ship's captain 
wired back: "Raised hell. 
Arriving Thursday."

Lu".
The versitile star, who plays 10 

instruments (woodwinds, piano, 
guitar, saxaphone. and keyboards), 
has recorded many instantly 
recognizable vocals since he made 
his recording debut in 1981 with "It 
Turns Me Inside Out". He quickly 
followed that hit with a string of 
charter-toppers: "Ring On Her 
Fingers, Time On Her Hands", 
"She's Lying" and "Ain't No Trick 
(It Takes Magic)."

In 1983, Greenwood's "I.O.U." 
became a signature song for him 
and in 1984 he recorded "God Bless 
The U.S.A.", which has become 
one of the most played songs of all 
time. He was a smashing success 
with the song at George Bush's 
inauguration, as it was followed by 
a gigantic fireworks demonstration.

His awards have run the gamut, 
including Best New Artist an Male 
Vocalist of the Year, among others. 
In 1984, Greenwood took home a 
Grammy for B est Male 
Performance and in 1991, he was a 
Grammy nominee for his hit duet 
single, "Hopelessly Yours," with 
labelmate Suzy Boggess.

The native of California resides 
in Nashville.

For more information About 
Cattle Barons Ball, call the 
American Cancer Society office in 
Lubbock at 792-7126.

LOUI6/V6 LETTED
Dear Louisa,

We have two teenage 
daughters and my friends 
think I am very old fash­
ioned because I insist on 
being at home at night 
when they are supposed 
to come in or when they 
have guests.

The girls say it is not 
necessary because they 
know right from wrong 
and know how to behave. 
Well, I have tried to make 
them understand that it is 
not because I don't trust 
them but I do this not 
only to protect them from 
bad situations that might 
occur if  they were alone 
but to give them the as­
surance that no mattei 
what happens, 1 will be 
there waiting for therr 
and there will be no ques­
tions as to when they are 
expected home. I think 
this gives the girls a 
scapegoat when others 
try to persuade them to go 
places they know they are 
not allowed to visit or to 
do things that will not be 
noticed the following 
day.

What do you think 
about this?

Mother—Conn.
Answer:

I think you are wise 
mother and will find out 
that the things you give 
up today will probably 
save you a lot of trouble 
and heartache later on.

-Louisa.

VISITING TRACTOR SHOW......Tom Bowen of Muleshoe and Benny
Williams of Littlefield look at the various toy tractors at the Toy Show 
held last Saturday at the Bailey County Coliseum. (Journal Photo)

Announcement
^  We at Damron Drug 

are primarily a health 
oriented business, we wish 

to announce that beginning 
July 1, 1993 we shall 
become a smoke-free 

establishment.

We appreciate your 
cooperation in helping us 

to maintain this atmosphere 
in Damron Drug 

and Lindas'Kitchen.

Along with this concept, 
there will be no further sale 

of tobaccos in our store

We hope to continue to 
serve you.
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Worths flop (To feature A  Variety 

O f Activities
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Charles Sawtelle, one of the 
most distinctive guitarists on the 
bluegrass music scene today, will 
be a special guest for South Plains 
College’s annual bluegrass 
Workshop Week, scheduled for July 
25-30.

Registration deadline is July 10.
The annual event has 

traditionally attracted bluegrass 
music fans and musicians from 
throughout the nation and overseas. 
About 60 people are thus far signed 
up for this summer's round of 
activities, which include instruction 
on banjo, mandolin, bass, fiddle, 
and guitar, concerts, jam sessions, 
a cookoff, gospel sing-a-long, 
guitar repair, music theory and 
other topics. This year's 
participants are signed up from 
such varied places as Colorado 
Springs, Colo., Rochester, N.Y., 
Gresham, Ore., and Moorpark, 
Calif., as well as Austin, Houston, 
and Fort Worth.

The workshop is taught by 
members of Country Gazette, a 
prem iere b luegrass band 
headquartered at SPC, Gerald Jones, 
experienced in recording and live 
performance in Dallas, and special 
guest Sawtelle. He is a founding 
member of the bluegrass group. 
Hot Rizc and is also an experienced 
acoustic music sound technician.

Cost for five days of instruction 
and activities is $225 a person. 
Meals and lodging will also be 
available in SPC's residence halls 
at a cost of $110 per person based 
on double occupancy. Water and 
electricity hookups for recreational 
vehicles are available on lighted, 
level sites within walking distance 
of workshop classes. Cost for an 
RV hookup is $10 per day. Meals 
may be purchased in the college's 
dining hall at an additional package 
price of $60.

Instructors ar Alan Munde on 
intermediate and advanced banjo; 
Gerald Jones on beginning banjo; 
Dawn Watson on mandolin. Steve 
Gamer on bass; Ed Marsh on Fiddle; 
Joe Carr an Charles Sawtelle on 
intermediate/advanced flatpicking 
lead guitar styles; and Dave Hardy, 
beginning guitar.

The workshop schedule includes 
sign-in and registration at 3 p.m. 
July 25, orientation from 7-8 p.m. 
that night and a jam session at 8 
p.m. Other activities throughout 
the week will include music theory 
for bluegrass pickers, instrument 
workshops and lessons, singing and 
harmony workshop, private 
lessons, ensemble workshops and 
lessons, singing and harmony 
workshop, private lessons,
ensemble workshops, vocal 
workshop, masters of bluegrass and 
a student showcase concert.

Special events will include a 
cookout and jam session at 6 p.m. 
July 26, group singing at 8 p.m. 
July 27. tour at 7 p.m. July 28, 
country dance with lessons at 8

p.m. Ju ly  28, and free concert by 
County Gazette at 7 p.m. July 29.

The instructors are experienced in 
their field. Munde, a fulltime music 
faculty member at SPC, was a 
founding member of Country 
Gazette, and has recorded many top­
selling albums of banjo music.

Steve Gamer has performed with 
Byron Berline, Buddy Spicher and 
Billy Foster. He toured one 
summer with SPC's country music 
road show. Country Caravan, and 
later worked in a nightly music 
show in Custer, S.D.

Joe Carr, also a fulltime faculty 
member at SPC, began his 
professional career with Toanoke 
before joining Country Gazette. 
He served as emcee for the group 
in addition to playing guitar. In 
addition to his recordings with 
Gazette, he has made several fiddle, 
guitar and mandolin teaching 
courses available.

Dawn Watson, a member of 
Country Gazette and a fulltime 
bluegrass music faculty member, 
has taken top prizes in mandolin 
contests, including the 1989 
Arizona State Championship. She 
later moved to Nashville and 
worked with the touring band 
Petticoat Junction and studied with 
mandolin picker Bobby Clark.

Dave Hardy, guitarist with 
Country Gazette, performed with 
numerous championship bands in 
the west and has been a winner of 
the songwriting contest at the 
National Flatpicking Champion­
ship in Winfield. Kan. for two 
years in a row. He has a master's 
degree in educational psychology 
and has been a professional educator 
for 15 years. He is an instructor in 
SPC’s learning center.

Fiddler Ed Marsh, originally 
from Virginia, is one of the longest 
tenured faculty members in SPC's 
bluegrass music program. He has 
extensive experience in bluegrass 
fiddling and teaching.

Registration for the workshop 
may be completed by returning a 
registration form and reluming it to 
SPC. A deposit of $100 must 
accompany registration in order to 
reserve a seat in the classes.

For more information, contact 
the SPC Continuing Education 
Office at South Plains College, 
1401 College Avenue, Levelland, 
Texas, 79336, or phone SPC at 
(806) 894-9611, ext. 341.

A  Study in English
"1 want to be procrasti­

nated at the next comer,” 
said the passenger to the 
bus driver.

" Y ou want tobe what?" 
demanded the driver.

"Don't lose your tem­
per. 1 had to look in the 
dictionary myself before 
I found out that procrasti­
nate means put off."

Car Wash
Saturday, June 19 

Burton Service Center 
10 a.m.-5 p.m.

Cars, Pickups, Suburbans 
Sponsored By:

AAU Teams For Nationals

Microwave 
Tips

How far into food do micro- 
waves in a microwave oven 
penetrate.

They vary with different 
foods but the maximum is 1 1/2 
inches and the minimum about 
3/4ths o f  an inch. They cause 
no chemical change in food; 
they produce heat through the 
vibration o f food molecules, 
produced by these electromag­
netic waves (microwaves).

Fat and moisture are drawn 
to the surface, but the surface 
doesn't become crisp; it browns 
only with long-cooking foods.

Perfect Attendance Awards went to Fourth Graders: Joe Adair, Jennifer Castorena, Jose Gonzales, Bobby 
Guerrero, Fidel Lira, Michael Lopez, Kourtnee Marr, Lupe Nunez, Lisa Ramirez, Christopher Seymore, and 
Chyla Torres.

WaCtz Across <Te?cas
iDance Set

Museum A n d  University Seef^fCeCp 
In  Locating Documentation

The next "Waltz Across Texas" 
dance will be held Saturday, June 
19, 1993 at 8:00 p.m. at the Lamb 
County Ag Center on Hwy 385 in 
Littlefield, Texas.

Providing outstanding country 
western dance music will be the 
"Blue Denim Band" of Lubbock. 
This popular band which boasts 
seven accomplished musicians, 
plays regularly at the Lubbock 
Club and Hillcrest County Club.

Admission to the dance is $4 per 
person, $6 per couple and $10 per 
family, children under 10 are 
admitted bee.

Drinks and snacks will be 
available at the concession stand. 
NO alcohol allowed.

This dance is sponsored by the 
Littlefield Arts and Heritage

Committee. The proceeds go to 
provide a successful FREE July 4th 
concert by Waylon Jennings. This 
year he will have Willie Nelson 
performing with him. The concert 
will be Saturday, July 3, 1993 at 8 
p.m. at the Lamb County Ag. 
Center. Fans will need to bring 
blankets or lawn chairs for seating.

A hospitality hour for Singles 
will be held prior to the dance June 
19th at 7 p.m. at the Lamb Co. Ag 
Center. Area single people of all 
ages are invited to come and get 
acquainted and plan other events for 
the summer. Sandwiches, hors 
d’oeuvres and drinks will be served.

n
Call 806-385-4996 or the Waylon 
hotline at 806 395-6172 for more 
information.

SLrt O f Caring (Photography 
Contest ‘To (Be (Held

Caring insuiuie invites amateur p rom otion  o f
and professional photographer to 
enter the sixth annual Art of Caring 
photography contest. Award­
winning photographer Yousuf 
Karsh, ABC-TV Director of 
Photography East Coast, Brent 
Peterson, and actress Susan 
Sullivan will head the panel of 
judges that will select the three 
entries that best capture the essence 
of caring.

The purpose of this project, 
sponsored by the Caring Instituter 
and the Eastman Kodak Company , 
is to inspire the creation of images 
that speak from heart to heart and 
convey the message of caring.

Winning photographs will be 
exhibited and will appear in Caring 
People, Caring Magazine, and in 
publications of the Caring 
Institute. Those images judged 
most imaginative and which best 
capture the essence of caring will 
be recognized and rewarded ($200, 
First Place; $150, Second Place; 
and $125., Third Place.) Ten 
honorable mention finalists will 
also be designated.

There is no entry fee. but each 
submission must be accompanied 
by a completed entry form. Photos 
may be either color or black and 
white. All photographs must be 
8"xl0". To obtain information on 
the contest and an entry blank, 
please send a self addressed, 
stamped business envelope to: Art 
of Caring, Caring Institute, 519 C 
Street, NE, Washington. DC 
20002. All entries must be 
received by Friday, August 6, 
1993.

The Caring Institute, a nonprofit 
organization, is dedicated to the

in te g rity , 
community, and service to others. 
Working toward the goal of a more 
coring society, the Institute 
sponsors various programs in 
addition to the Art of Caring, to 
include the National Caring 
Awards, the establishment of the 
Frederick Douglass Museum and 
Hall of Fame for Caring 
Americans, and Caring Clubs for 
students.

The History Department at West 
Texas A & M University and the 
Panhandle-Plains H istorical 
Museum at Canyon plan to mark 
the 60th anniversary of the 
beginning of the New Deal with a 
museum exhibit and two-day 
conference at West Texas A & M.

In preparation for the project, 
the Museum and the History 
Department at WTAMU Canyon 
wish to locate individuals who 
participated in New Deal programs 
in the Texas Panhandle-Plains 
region from 1933 until 1942.

Information especially is needed 
to compile an inventory of projects 
conducted by various New Deal 
agencies, including the National 
Youth Administration (NYA), 
National Recovery Administration 
(NR A ), Farm  S e c u rity  
Administration (FSA), Civilian 
Conservation Corp (CCC), Works 
Progress Administration (WPA), 
Public Works Administration 
(P W A ) , C iv i l  W orks 
Administration (CWA), Soil 
Conservation Service (SCS) and 
the Shelterbelt Project.

"We also arc looking for 
photographs of New Deal projects 
and related artifacts. Tnese items 
include tools, posters, documents, 
clothing, quilts, furniture, or 
anything else pertaining to the New 
Deal. The Museum may wish to 
photograph or borrow such objects 
for the exhibit," said Bill Green,

Curator of History for the PPHM.
If you participated in New Deal 

.programs or have photographs or 
other materials relating to the New 
Deal in this region, please contact: 
Dr. Bill Green, Curator of History, 
Panhandle-Plains H istorical 
Museum, Canyon, Texas 79016 or 
call (806) 656-2264.

Entitled ”A Visual Legacy: The 
New Deal on the Texas Plains," the 
exhibit will open at the Museum 
September 4, 1993 and close 
January 16, 1994. The conference 
on the campus of WTAMU 
October 1 and 2, 1993, concludes 
with a tour of surviving New Deal 
sites.

father's
‘

(Day!
at

June 20, 
1993

.■w s .<.w s w > m « s — — — —

in-
tii*

106 East American Blvd 272-7504

AND COUNTRY JUNCTION 
Biggest Little Boot Shop In Texas

Muleshoe, Texas

Father's Day , Sunday, June 20th

Pass It On
You’ve worked hard to get where you are today. If you’re like most people, you’ve put years 
of careful effort into building and maintaining your estate. And, like most people, you probably 
want to have your estate distributed among your family and friends after you pass away.

Unfortunately, estate taxes may take a big bite — with rates as high as 50 percent. Probate and 
administrative fees may consume another 5 to 10 percent. And the estate your heirs receive 
may be quite a bit smaller than the one you left. It doesn’t seem fair, does it?

Fortunately, there are a number of strategies you can use to make certain your estate goes to 
the people you want it to. Some will even help your heirs avoid estate taxes and probate.

Come to our FRKE workshop on estate planning. W e’ll show you how you can pass on your 
estate to your heirs. Instead of the probate court and tax collectors.

_____________________________________ Presented By:

7:00 pm - 8:30 pm Todd E* Ho,t
June 29,1993 and

Muleshoe Civic Center Eau* ^c'dd» CLU
--------------------------------------   C hartered Financial Consultant

Space is limited. Call <*06>7»i.8547 for reservations.

/
M mNTANfi

ILVERSM1TKS
•Golf Markers - Letter Openers 

- Key Chains - 

-Checkbook Covers-

Just In!
Baxter Black..............  Books, Videos & Cassettes
Curt Brummett.......................... Books & Cassettes

Brass Boot Jacks
Thurs, Fri & Sat 

ALL Mens Shirts 20% off
Register To Win Your Dad An Initial 
Key Ring By Montana Silversmith!

Drawing, Sat, June 19th
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Around
Muleshoe...
Morton Area Chamber of 
Commerce will hold a city wide 
Garage Sale Sat. June 19, 1993. 
Maps are available at the Chamber 
office-107 NW 1st, (Morton 
Tribune • Office). for more 
information, call 266-5200 or 266- 
5576.

* * *

Come hear the Continental Singers 
in concert as they bring their 1993 
"Stand Up--Move Out" tour to 
Lubbock, Texas on June 20th and 
23rd. No admission fee-a free will 
offering will be taken. Let's get 
back to the basic Christian values 
that our nation was founded on. 
Come hear the CONTINENTALS 
in concert at 7:00 p.m. Sunday 
evening, June 20th at First 
Christian Church, 232 Broadway, 
and on Wednesday evening, June 
23rd, at Westminister Presbyterian 
Church, 3321-33rd, in Lubbock. 
For more information, call First 
C h ris tian , 763-1995 , or 
Westminister Presbyterian, 799- 
3621.

* * *

Feel better! Look better! Work 
better! Enjoy life more fully! Bike 
riding is an exercise perscription for 
your health.

The American Heart Association 
urges a program of frequent, 
ongoing activity that is rhythmic, 
is repetitive involves motion 
using large muscles and challenges 
the circulator system. Bike riding 
fits the bill.

The Tom Hutchison Memorial 
Bike Tour is Saturday, June 19, at 
Knights of Columbus Hall, 1/4 
mile east of Slide on Hwy 1585 in 
Lubbock.

Staging of 25, 50 and 62 mile 
rides will be at 7:30 a.m., with 
rides beeinning at 8:05. A fun

S ch o o l...
Cont. From Page 1

The board also amended the 
1S93-94 calendar and the budget.

Options for a student accident 
plan was discussed and an accident 
policy adopted.

Informational reports were given 
from Mrs. Purdy, Superintendent 
Bill Moore; and the assis­
tant superintendents and Jo 
Mayhugh, business manager.

W alk-A -T hon ...
Cont. From Page 1 

to You!!
If you did not have an 

opportunity to sponsor a walker, 
there are donation jars around town 
to give everyone a chance to 
partic ipa te  in celebrating 
INDEPENDENCE DAY in 
Muleshoe with our spectacular 
fireworks display! Or mail a check 
to Jennyslippers. P.O. Box 153, 
Muleshoe, Texas 79347.

Again Thank You- 
The Jennyslippers.

ride of 10 miles will stage at 10 
a.m. This ride is designed for 
parents and children and registration 
fee is $5 per rider. Registration for 
the other rides is $15 per rider.

Riders are urged to stay for 
.lunch which will be provided by 
the sponsors. There will be a prize 
drawing for all registered riders. All 
proceeds benefit the American Heart 
Association.

For more information or to 
register call 792-6394.

July Fourth...
Cont. From Page 1
during the years of 1988 through 
1991.

In January of 1991, at the 
invitation of Congressman Charles 
Stcnholm of Texas, he recited the 
Cowboy's Prayer at the National 
Prayer Breakfast in Washington 

D.C. President and Mrs. Bush and 
the Rev. Billy Graham were in 
attendance along with represen­
tatives of 140 nations for this 
annual event.

In April of 1991, the Texas 
Legislature named Red Steagall as 
the official Cowboy Poet of Texas.

Panel Appointed 
To Refine Cotton 

Industry*s Plan
The National Cotton Council of 

America has created a special 
strategic planning committee to 
refine the U.S. cotton industry's 
long-range plan for competing in a 
ra p id ly -c h a n g in g  g lobal 
environment.

Formation of the committee, 
which is comprised of Council 
officers and leaders representing all 
seven industry segments, was 
announced at the spring meeting of 
Council directors in Washington, 
DC.

"Our aim is to either reconfirm 
goals or identify new ones that will 
enable the Council to accomplish 
long-range objectives toward 
ensuring industry profitability," 

'said Council President W. Neely 
Mallory.

"The appointment of this 
committee should not be seen as a 
signal of any skepticism about the 
effectiveness of our current 
program," Mallory said. "I can’t 
imagine a program that better 
equips us to operate profitably in 
today's environment. However, 
given the change that is inevitable,
I think it is prudent for us to 
develop the best possible 
understanding of the environment 
in which we will be called on to 
operate in the years ahead.”

The Memphis warehouse said 
some of the fronts on which change 
already is affecting the industry and 
is likely to do so in the future 
include: new leadership in 
Washington, federal government 
allocations for agriculture, 
environmental demands, new trade 
agreements, political reform around 
the world and new production and 
processing technology.

Former Council President 
Tommy Funk, a Harlingen, TX 
producer, will chair the committee.

It‘s a real deal! The 14-lbf Hungr-Buster*, fries, drink, 
and a sundae All for one low price!

On Sale|une7-27,1993
(•Rag TM Am O Q Corp ‘ Rag TM T» OQ Op Coon ©Tx D O Op Coon tpre-cooked weigh! 

At partm, n..-,g Dairy Queen stores

Full M eal D eal “

Let's Have A 
Father's Day 

Cookout!!

. Winkler's
Homemade German Sausage

Cut & Wrapped 
To Your Specifications!

Pork Country 
Style Ribs £

Fresh Ground Cross
Black Pepper

1 lb.

Steaks

Galveston Gears Up For First Summer With Alcohol-Free Beaches SLation regarding
GALVESTON, TEXAS ... The City The park is located on FM 3005 at grocery store and recreation areas. Galveston's beaches, contact the 
of Galveston is gearing up for the an- Seven-Mile Road, at the west end of Alcohol is permitted within legal limi- Galveston Island Convention and Visi- 
nual throngs of summer visitors with Galveston's seawall. Delian era pro- tations. tors Bureau at 2106 Seawall Boule-
an approach designed to keep its vides 1,000 feet of sandy beach comple- Day parking is $3 per vehicle. For var(ji Galveston, Texas 77550; 409/
beaches safe and fun. Galveston City mented by 50 full RV hook-ups, day more information or reservations, call 763-4311, 800/351-4236 (Texas) or 
Council recently passed an ordinance parking, showers, laundry facilities, 409/740-0390. 800/351-4237 (outside Texas),
prohibiting the consumption of alco­
hol on all beaches from 16-Mile Road 
to San Luis Pass from June 1 through 
September 30. The City Council also 
voted to prohibit driving on the 18- 
Mile Road Beach in order to return the 
beach to pedestrians and to improve 
public safety.

The Galveston Park Board of Trust­
ees, in a related decision, recently voted 
to ban alcohol consumption from its 
Stewart Beach Park, with the excep­
tion of licensed concession areas. The 
ban will be in effect year-round. The 
Park Board will also sponsor family- 
oriented entertainment, such as volley­
ball tournaments and sandcastle com­
petitions at Stewart Beach throughout 
the summer.

Also on the drawing board is an 
ambitious plan to replenish the se­
verely-eroded beaches along the 
Galveston Seawall. The area to be re­
stored runs from 10th to 61st Streets, 
and will extend 300 feet out from the 
Seawall.

Galveston's temperate weather and 
32 miles of sandy beaches attract swim­
mers, fishermen, sailors, and families 
on outings throughout the year, and the 
island's m unicipally maintained 
beaches provide a variety of facilities 
to accommodate them.

Security on Galveston beaches is 
provided by the Galveston Police De­
partment, Galveston Park Board and 
Galveston County Beach Patrol. Life­
guards arc on duty at Stewart Beach 
Park and R. A. Apffel East Beach Park.
Stewart Beach Park

Galveston's principal beach park and 
recreation area, located at the intersec­
tion of Broadway and Seawall Boule­
vards, attracts a young crowd of sun- 
bathers and fun lovers. Stewart Beach 
boasts an outdoor pavilion containing 
concessions, gifts shops, showers and 
restroom facilities. Attractions include 
volleyball courts, a water slide, bumper 
boats and cars, go-carts, miniature golf, 
and a children's playground.

The consumption of alcohol is not 
permitted, except within licensed con­
cession areas.

Parking is $5 per vehicle. For more 
information, call 409/765-5023.
R.A. Apffel East Beach Park

R A  Apffel East Beach Park is a 
sprawling beach with sandy dunes lo­
cated at the east end of the island. The 
park is a popular spot for jetty and snrf 
fishing, as well as birdwatching. Bait 
camps, restaurants, and an 11,000- 
square-foot pavilion featuring a gift 
shop, concessions, showers and 
restrooms are available to visitors. 
Alcohol is permitted within legal limi­
tations.

R A  Apffel East Beach Park is the 
site of the annual AIA Sandcastle Com­
petition, which inspires imaginative 
feats of sandsculpting by area archi­
tects. This year’s event is scheduled for 
Saturday, June 12.

Take Broadway to Seawall Blvd.; 
turn left, then right on Boddeker Drive. 
Admission is $5 per vehicle.

Season passes, available at $35 per 
vehicle, permit unlimited access to 
Apffel Park now through December 
31. Passes are on sale at the Galveston 
Park Board of Trustees office, 2102 
Seawall Blvd., and at Apffel Park. For 
more information, call 409/763-6564 
or 409/763-0166.
Seawolf Park

One of Galveston's most popular 
attractions, Seawolf Park offers his­
tory, fishing and fun. The site once 
served as a quarantine station for im­
migrants entering the United Stales. 
Today it features a collection of mili­
tary hardware, including the World 
War II submarine Cavalla and the de­
stroyer escort U.S.S. Stewart, both open 
to visitors.

Anglers can try their luck from dawn 
to dusk at the fishing pier or along the 
rocks. Flounder, trout and redfish are 
likely catches. Bait is available for 
purchase.

A three-level outdoor pavilion pro­
vides concessions, catering for private 
parties, and a vantage point for watch­
ing shrimp boats, pleasure craft, cargo 
ships and the Bolivar Ferry. A nearby 
playground provides fun for children.

Seawolf Park is located on Pelican 
Island. From Broadway, head north on 
51st Street. Park admission is $3 pa- 
vehicle. Admission to the submarine 
and ship are $2 for adults and $1 for 
children. Fishing is $2 for adults and 
$1 for children. Alcohol is permitted 
within legal limitations.
Dcllancra RV Park

Dcllanera RV Park is designed for 
day visitors as well as those traveling 
in recreational vehicles and campers.

WALK/BIKE A THON PRIZE WINNERS— Donna Kirk, Billie Downing, Chasity Spencer, Lauren Edler, 
Andy Sain, Gabriel Villegas, and Theron Edler all received prizes for walking or riding in the Walk/Bike A Thon 
held recently. Also pictured is Andy Sain's little brother. (Guest Photo)

Sports

Quiz

By Christian Thorlund
1. Who won the Indy 500?
2. Who won the recent 
Coca-Cola 600?
3. Who won the NFL Golf 
Classic (N.J.)?
4. What M.L. player has 
the most hits in the last 10 
years?
5. What pitcher has the 
most wins in the decade?

Answers:
1. Emerson Fittipaldi.
2. Dale Earnhardt.
3 . LeeTravino.
4. Wade Boggs—1980.
5. Jack Morris.

MciIq Putt 
Golf Course

Is Now Open
Still $1 A Game 

Hours
WED, - SAT....7 P M -11 PM
SUNDAY.........3 P M -11 PM

MON. & T U E S . RESERVED FOR PARTIES 
FOR RESERVATIONS CALL 

GLEN MORRIS- -272-4329 
JIM LUTZ-272-4632

W est Texas

Seasoning Salt

1

1 1/2 lb.

U 2 . 2 5

By The Strip 1.60
Winkler Meat Co.

401 Main Muleshoe 272-4703

2Z2Z3ZZ272222ZZ:
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Awards Presented To Local High School Students—(Back L-R) Aaron Gilleland, Debate; Mason 
Conklin,Chemistry I; (MiddleL-R) Latonya Payne, Biology I; Stephanie Quintana, Theater II; Jesus 
Flores, Biology I; Chris Dominguez, District Pres, TFT A; (Front L-R) Jeanne Cox, TFTA Outstanding 
Member, Staci Harris, Chemistry II; Scott Meramontes, Local Pres. Speech-Theater; Keitha Glover, 

f  Theater I. ( Journal Photo)

BTU Energy Tax Will Ask Agriculture
To Shoulder An Unfair Burden
When Washington starts talking 

taxes, it doesn't take long for the 
m, powers that be to set their sights
*  on agriculture. Right this minute 

the new Administration is taking 
aim. Once again some folks who 
don't know much about agriculture 
are determined to put an unfair 
burden on the people who earn their 
livings form farming and ranching.

I'm talking about the Clinton 
Administration's proposed Btu tax. 

jq Btu stands for British thermal 
units-but, believe me, it's not 
about taxing the British. It's about 
increasing agriculture's energy bill 
by some one BILLION dollars or 
about 2 percent of total net farm 
income.

For Texas nurserymen it will 
mean higher greenhouse heating 
bills--especially in north and 

0  northeastern Texas—and higher 
costs for fertilizer and other 
chemical inputs.

Put simply, the Btu tax is based 
on heat content of fuels. It's like 
taxing food on its calorie content. 
The higher the calories, the higher 
the tax, or in this case, the more 
Btu's in a fuel, the more it is taxed. 
It will mean paying 7 1/2 cents

•  more for a gallon of gasoline, 8.3 
cents more for a gallon of diesel, 
2.3 cents more for a gallon of 
propane and about 4.6 percent more 
for each kilowatt of electricity. 
Prices for fertilizer, chemicals and 
other energy intensive farm inputs 
will also increase. The average 
Texas producer can expect a 
minimum price tag of $2 an acre in

0  direct energy costs.
Somebody must have told the 

President farmers work for free. 
Somebody must have convinced 
him that agricultural producers 
don't send their kids to college. 
They don’t have mortgages to pay.
They don't have the right to a fair 
and reasonable profit.

The Btu tax is simply one more 
example of agriculture being asked 
to bear its unfair share. We are 
willing to do our part. Certainly 
that is the responsibility of every 
American citizen. But agriculture 
represents only a small percentage 
of the country's population. It 
should not be singled out to carry 
such a heavy load. Increasing

agriculture's production costs will 
only serve to weaken the industry's 
economic growth and reduce U.S. 
competition in international 
markets just as these markets 
become more competitive.

This is not just a bad tax, it's a 
bad and confusing tax. It's a tax 
that will require another 
bureaucracy just to administer it. 
Then we can pay more money to 
finance the bureaucrats who are 
collecting more of our tax dollars. 
It just doesn't make any sense.

How many Americans can even 
explain what a Btu is? And how 
many will understand what this tax 
means until it's too late and the 
bills come in?

Agriculture has taken some 
mighty big hits in recent years, and 
this won't be the last. In addition to 
the Btu tax, the Clinton
Administration wants to cut an 

-additional $500 million in farm 
payments. That means agriculture's 
‘total bill will come to $1.5 billion.

The Clinton administration 
believes it can raise $71.4 billion 
over five years with this tax 
proposal. It claims the proposal 
will help to reduce the country's 
deficit. But I believe this tax is 
regressive and inflationary-a tlircat- 
not an answer-to our economic 
recovery. .

The new folks in Washington 
say that these new taxes are part of 
a fair and balanced package that will 
show long-term deficit reduction. 
But who really believes that is the 
case? Congress will pig out on 
this new money. It has never used 
the money from any tax increase 
for deficit reduction. The 
Adm inistration has already 
proposed $295 million in new 
spending for this year, and this is 
even before the bill for the health 
care package come in, which could 
be over $100 billion.

It's up to all of us to let 
Washington know how we feel 
before the vote is taken, before the 
decision is made. It is not too late. 
It may be hard to defeat the Btu tax. 
but no battle was ever won without 
firing the first shot. It is important 
to write our congressman and 
senators. If we're willing to be 
heard, there's an outside change to

influence the outcome on the 
energy tax.

More than 200 years ago, there 
was a patriotic silversmith named 
Paul Revere. As you recall, he 
earned his place in history by 
alerting his neighbors: "The British 
are coming."

Well, they’re coming again. Not 
by land. Not by sea. Not marching 
in with easy-to-spot bright red 
coats. But sneaking into our lives 
disguised as a "friendly'' energy tax.

A friendly tax that can suck the 
life out of agriculture. A friendly 
tax that can destroy the agrarian 
way of life that those patriots 
fought for. A friendly tax that 
should be shot down with musket 
balls, not accepted with a resigned 
handshake.

Our forefathers whipped the 
British once for us. And we must 
do it again for ourselves-and for 
our kids.__________________

News From 
Baylor College 

o f Medicine
Contrary to some myths, there 

is sex after 60 says, a psychologist 
at Baylor College of Medicine in 
Houston.

’’Sexual expression can continue 
to be a part of life into our sixties, 
seventies and beyond,” s<:id Dr. 
Naomi Nelson, an assistant 
professor of neurology at Baylor. 
"We know in terms of etiquette 
how to eat soup in a restaurant, but 
we don't know what society says is 
an appropriate expression of 
sexuality among older people."

Nelson says people get caught 
up in social customs and behavior 
and miss the big picture of what 
it's like to be a sexual being all of 
their lives.

A major obstacle that many 
aging people need to overcome is 
the perception that they will lose 
the physical ability to have an 
active sex life. There arc physical 
changes but. Nelson said, sex can 
still be a part of a healthy, active 
person's life.

Doctors say some older men 
might have a slower arousal period, 
but that doesn't mean the libido or 
desire has decreased. There may also 
be a less forceful ejaculation. This 
is not a sign of trouble as much as 
it is a sign of normal aging.

Women may also experience 
dryness during arousal as they age,
which may be a sign of the normal 
aging process.

"Men and women should not be 
frightened by such changes," 
Nelson said. "Although, it is also a 
good idea for elderly men and 
women to talk with their 
physicians and discuss their 
concerns."

It is generally accepted that the 
more physically active people arc 
sexually, the better their sexual 
organs will function.

"Physical changes are not the 
only barrier to being comfortable 
with sexuality," Nelson said. "The 
elderly need to fight stereotypes 
about sexual attitudes and behaviors 
and have frank, open discussions 
with their mates."

Even though some elderly 
couples may still have a sex drive, 
they often do not feel comfortable 
talking about sexuality with their 
partners. Nelson's advice is to stop 
thinking of sex as something to he 
enjoyed only in youth.

"Stop thinking of scr as 
something in the past. Think of 
sexuality as a part of life, and. as 
long as you still have life, live it 
to the fullest." Nelson said.

Richland Hills Baptist 
Church

Begins Van Ministry

"Maybe you are unable to drive, or you can­
not take your kids to church as you would 
like. We will come get you and take you to 
Sunday Morning bible study and Worship 
Service," says pastor Terry Taylor.

"We have a wonderful Children's and Youth 
department, and we are beginning a College 
and Career department this month as well," 
says Taylor. These ministries are overseen by 
Associate pastor Derek Pressley.

The van will pick people up at 9 a.m. Bible 
Study begins at 9:30 and Worship at 10:45.

If you are interested, please call 272-4813 
or 272-3229 and register; or come by the 
church at 17th and Avenue D.

Space is limited so if you want to sign-up 
you need to call today. There is no fee for 
this service.

Study Links Reduced 
Infant Deaths To 
Benefits Of Texas 

WIC Program
A recent study has credited 

participation by pregnant women in 
the Texas WIC program (the 
Special Supplemental Foods 
Program for Women, Infants, and 
Children) with reducing deaths of 
babies born to Medicaid mothers. 
The Texas Department of Health 
(TDH) administers the WIC 
program.

The Mathematica Policy 
Research, Inc. studied infant 
m ortality among M edicaid 
recipients' newborns in Texas, 
F lorida, M innesota, North 
Carolina, and South Carolina. The 
babies of Medicaid mothers who 
also participated in WIC ewre less 
likely to die in infancy than ewre 
the babies of mothers who have 
medicaid who did not have WIC's 
help.

"This study is further proof that 
WIC works, that WIC is a win-win 
program for kids and for taxpayers," 
Debra Stabcno said. Stabeno is 
chief of the TDH Bureau of WIC 
Nutrition.

"Earlier studies have shown that 
taxpayers save $2.44 in Medicaid 
costs for every dollar we spend on 
WIC in the first two months of a 
baby's life," Stabeno said. "This 
new study shows that the WIC 
Program not only ensures the 
health and development of our most 
vulnerable infants and children, it 
actually saves lives.”

Among the babies of Medicaid 
recipients, the study estimated that 
infant deaths of WIC participants 
occur about one-fouth to two-thirds . 
as often as infant deaths of non- 
WIC participants. In comparing 
infant mortality in the two groups, 
the greatest difference appeared 
among the babies' deaths occuring 
within the first 28 days.

In Texas, the study tracked all 
Medicaid births from January

Advanced Criminal 
Investigation Course 

Scheduled At SPC
An advanced investigation 

eotfrse for law enforcement officers 
Is ischeduled June 28-30 at South 
Plains College.

Classes will meet 8 a.m.-5 p.m. 
daily in the SPC Petroleum/Law 
Enforcement Technology Building, 
room 115. Cost is $24 a person.

Registration deadline is June 25.
The course is designed to help 

the student develop investigative 
techniques in areas of unusual 
criminal activity, explained Larry 
Nichols, associate professor of law 
enforcement technology at SPC. 
"Students will participate in 
iiiyestigative learning techniques of 
covert operations, organized crime, 
surveillance techniques, pretext 
interviews, collaboration of 
witnesses and co-defendant 
testimony, and they will be 
ek'posed to the equipment involved 
in these techniques," he said.

tJ Students will receive 24 hours 
of credit from the Texas 
Commission of Law Enforcement 
Officer Standards and Education.

A minimum of 10 persons is 
required for the course.

• For more information, contact 
SPC’s law enforcement office at 
894-9611, ext. 291.

through June in 1988. The 
statistics suggested that 103 more 
Medicaid infants during that period 
might have died had their mothers 
not had WIC assistance during 
pregnancy.

Funded by the U.S. Department 
of Agriculture, WIC provides 
nutrition education and vouchers for 
foods rich in calcium, iron and 
protein needed by childbearing 
women, their babies and children 
younger than 5.

Since 1988 in Texas, WIC’s 
monthly enrollment has increased 
from 250,000 to about 543,000. 
Stabeno announced that TDH 
recently received federal funding for 
WIC to serve 85,000 more Texas 
women and children.

Dr. David R. Smith, Texas 
Comissioner of Health said, "As a 
physician and as the health 
commissioner, I have seen the 
difference WIC makes in the lives 
of Texas' youngest citizens. Wic 
helps women to !,iave healthier 
pregnancies with fewer premature 
births. Their babies are likely to 
have higher birth weights."

"Also," he said, "WIC mothers 
tend to get prenatal care earlier in 
their pregnancies-a factor directly 
affecting the health of newborns."

Stabeno .added, "Everyone 
benefits when kids get a better 
nutritional start. WIC is 
committed to serve every eligible 
woman and child in Texas."

Residents Have Opportunity To 
Help Brazos River Authority 

Ensure Water Quality
Residents of the Caprock area 

will have an opportunity to help 
the Brazos River Authority ensure 
water quality when the basin's 
citizen advisory subcommittee 
meets.

Project advisory groups will be 
formed at this meeting to assist the 
Authority's water quality staff. Dale 
Pahmiyer, project administrator, 
said the project advisory groups 
help the Authority's water quality 
staff find the best approaches to 
water quality issues. The Texas 
Clean Rivers Program and 
volunteer citizen monitoring 
program will also be discussed at 
the meeting.

Project advisory groups within 
the basin will selected based upon 
meeting participant's interests in 
one of the following Clean Rivers 
programs: volunteer citizen water 
quality m onitoring, public 
awareness and involvement, 
groundwater, water conservation 
and data analysis.

The Brazos River Authority 
contracted with the Texas Water 
Commission in 1992 to assess 
water quality in the Brazos River 
Basin. Clean Rivers Act funding 
has allowed the Authority to 
expand its long-term water quality 
programs. Steering committees 
involving local citizens and 
industry representatives help the 
Authority identify key local and 
develop programs to maintain the 
basin's quality standards.

For further information, contact 
Cynthia Bothwell, the Authority's

Paying Best Prices 
for Old Pocket Watches 

and Wristwatches

field operations manager, or 
Pahmiyer at (817)772-6010, or Dan 
Hawkins, director of water utilities 
at (806)767-2595.

The Brazos River Authority was 
established in 1929 by the Texas 
Legislature and given responsibility 
for conserving and developing the 
surface water resources of the entire 
Brazos River Basin. The Authority 
is governed by a 21-member board 
of directors appointed by the 
Governor for six-year terms, 
subject to confirmation by the 
Texas Senate. Based in Waco, the 
Authority is self-supported by 
revenues from its own operations.

W h o  K n o w s ?

1. What company devel­
oped the tubeless tire?
2. Who said, "I have 
nothing to offer but 
blood, toil, tears and 
sweat"?
3. Name the father of 
Queen Elizabeth II.

Answers:
1. B.F. Goodrich Com­
pany of Akron, Ohio.
2. Winston Churchill, in 
1940, in his first speech 
as Prime Minister of Brit­
ain.
3. King George VI.

_____________________________________________ - ‘ ** *'

Jewelry and 
WATCH REPAIR

• Ring Sizing 2 Day Service
• Remounting & Diamond Setting
• Full Line Watch Batteries
• Neck Chains Repaired
• Jewelry Appraised for Insurance
• Faster Service
• Diamond Re-Tipping
• Prongs Repaired

E ^ 5

312 Main S o
1 8 9 1

762-9376
SB

Beat The Heat!!
Get Those 

Air Conditioners 
In Shape For 
The Coming 
Summer!!

Poynors Carry A Complete Line Of 
Champion Coolers

2800-5500 CFM (Down Draft & Window Units)
Pumps - Pads - All Water Hookups 

Motors (1 & 2 Speed) - Bearings

p
i

0 Y
103 Main W Muleshoe r a s s 272-4552
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Muleshoe Students Showered With Awards
M a r y  D eS h a zo

3rd grade studenls participating in Storeytelling (coach. Holly 
Henderson) were Laura Wood, Matthew Lopez-3rd place, Suzann 
Messenger, and James Hancock. (Journal Photo)

3rd grade students participating in Readywriting (coach, Jan King) were: 
Rendi Hodge, Kayla Glover, Jessica Carpenter-5th place, and Kayla 
Kelly. (JournL Photo!

4th grade students participating in Ready Writing (coach, Claire Brown) 
were Westin Price, Megan Tipps, Jeremy King-3rd place, and Louie 
Pacheco (Journal Photo)

5th grade students participating in Ready Writing (coach Pat Angeley) 
were Ashley Crawford, Stacy Locker-6th place. Brandy Whitt, and 
Lindsey Reid. (Journal Photo)

5th grade boys participating in Oral Reading (coach Joseph Sanchez) 
were Tyson Purdy-2nd place. Kolc Magby-4th place, Kyle Hahn-1st 
place, and Clint Black. (JournL Photo)

5th grade girls participating in Oral Reading (coach, Diann Evins) were 
Stacy Locker, Lindsey Black-lst place, Kayla Johnson, and Bobbie
Bcnham (Journal Photo)

CONGRATULATIONS U.I.L. PARTICIPANTS

3rd graders participating in Spelling (coach, Vickie Bundick) were AJ. 
Buhman-2nd place, Lincoln Riley-3rd place, Megan Barrett, and Eric 
Samarron. < lnuraal Photo)

4th graders participating in Spelling (coach, Nancy Benham) were 
Rachel Williams, Louie Pacheco, Stephanie Kirk-6th place, and 
Adrienne Ashford. (Journal Photo)

5th graders participating in Spelling (coach, Deborah Williams) were 
Patrick Black, Blake Gartin, Leisha Wallace, and Eric Posadas.

(Journal Photo)

5th graders participating in Number Sense (coach, Beth Skipworth) 
were Eric Posadas-2nd place, Kahal Bahakta-5lh place, James Barrett, 
and Joseph Anguiano. (Journal Photo)

5th graders participating in Picture Memory (coach, David Keller) were Kamal Bhakta. April Kelley, Toby 
Kitchens, Brandy Whitt, TJ. Hutto, and Cassandra Flores. Team placed 3rd. (Journal Photo)

«

4

\

4th graders participating in Picture Memory (coach, Tawna Ward) were Kinscc Estep, Lindsey Altman. Stephanie 
Kirk, Brandon Broyles, Rhea Gonzales, and Stephanie Sharp. Team placed 5th. (Journal Photo)

(
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Plague Found In Texas 
• Squirrels For First Time

The bubonic plague-the same 
disease that killed millions of 
people in the Middle Ages-has 
flared up in Texas wildlife again. 
An estimated 40 tree squirrels in 
the Mulberry Canyon region south 
of Merkel have died from the 
disease.

g  This is only the third major die­
off of squirrels reported since record 
keeping began in 1960, and the 
first time it has occurred in Texas. 
The other two instances were in 
Colorado, said Dr. Patrick Thomas 
of Abilene, zoonosis veterinarian 
with the state health department.

Also found positive in the area

were a feral (wild) cal that probably 
ate one of the infected squirrels, a 
racoon, and a rat flea. Texas 
Animal Damage Control Service 
trappers have confirmed the disease 
in four coyotes in that region, 
Thomas said.

The disease seems to be confirmed 
to that area for now, said Bradley 
Hicks, a health department 
zoonosis control specialist in 
Abilene.

The last major animal die-off was 
a 1988 prairie dog outbreak in a 14 
county area in the Permian Basin 
from Borden County to the Big 
Bend. Since that time, sporadic

•  LUBBOCK, Friday, June 11 , 1993
By Shaw n Wade

High Plains producers were on the 
receiving end of scattered rain showers 
during the past week that will be mostly 
beneficial according to Lubbock-based Plains 
Cotton Growers (PCG).

The only exception to the beneficial label 
. may be the area around Ackerly, Texas in 

Northeast Martin and Southeast Dawson 
counties where locally heavy rains totaled 
five to eight inches in some areas.

One or two isolated reports of hail in 
addition to the rainfall have also been 
recorded. It is fair to say that some acres can 
be expected to need replanting as a result of 
the past weeks weather, however an

•  accurate picture will probably not emerge 
until next week according to PCG officials.

The good news for many dryland 
producers in southern High Plains counties 
was the arrival of any rain at all. Most 
reports indicate that the rainfall totals may 
be just enough to get some “dry planted” 
acreage to a stand. Producers who did 

q receive enough rain to get a stand will still 
need additional rain before the resulting 
dryland stands can be considered safely 
established.

The irrigated side of the High Plains crop 
is in ’ good shajse according to John 
Gannaway, a cotton breeder at the Texas 
Agricultural Experiment Station. He adds 
that overall the area has gotten off to a fairly 

^ normal start with the usual mixed bag of 
crop conditions existing in the area.

Gannaway says that an overall rating for 
the 25-county area would still be fair to good 
at this time. Planting activity will likely 
begin to taper off in the next few days and 
will likely become predominantly replanting 
operations.

•  Hardest hit by the dry conditions are 
primarily dryland producers in the western 
edge of the High Plains. Many whose crop 
insurance planting dates have already 
passed are now in the process of getting 
claims filed so they can get back in the field 
and plant a secondary crop such as grain 
sorghum.

0 Without a general rain across this area
several thousand acres of dryland cotton will 
probably go to alternate crops.

FIXED RATE
LOAN PLAN

Long-term
Rural Real Estate Loans

Fixed Rate for First 10 Years

7 .8 5 % *
Annual p u rcw ifage ra to i are 8.07% h> 8.23% depending on 
length o f contract; after 10-year fixed rate period. Variable ra te i 
a re  subject to change.

LIMITED FUNDS AVAILABLE AT THESE RATES
■ NEW PURCHASES ONLY
■ LONG-TERM LOANS FULLY AMORTIZED
■ ASSUMABIE
■ RATE CONVERSIONS AVAILABLE AT END OF FIXED RATE PERIOD
■ OTHER LOAN PLANS AVAILABLE

FEDERAL Offices Located Throughout the State

T. a n d  B a n k  A s s o c ia t io n s
IN TEXAS

Federal Land Bank 
Association of Muleshoe

316  S. Main, Muleshoe

cases have been lound in carnivores 
tested by ADC trappers.

Health Department officials were 
alerted to the most recent outbreak 
when a Taylor County rancher, 
who asked not to be identified, 
found a weak squirrel atop a 
chicken coop.

After several members of the 
family had handled the squirrel, the 
rancher became concerned that it 
might have an infectious disease. 
He contacted the health department 
on March 23, and he and his family 
were referred to a physician for 
preventative treatment. Health 
officials then scoured a half-mile 
area around the site, finding only 
empty nests and no tree squirrels, 
leading them to believe that this 
was a major die-off.

They do not know whaf 
introduced the plague bacteria into 
the squirrel population, but believe 
it was transported through neigh­
boring nests through fleas. "We 
hope to find the cause,” Hicks said.

As long as the infected animals 
stay out of populated areas, the 
danger to humans is minimal, 
Thomas said. "The problem arises 
when a cat eats a squirrel or other 
rodent that is positive, then shows 
up at your back door. The fleas on 
that cat will jump on you or a 
family pet, anything that walks by. 
"Animals that appear to be sick 
should not be handled, he added

"Plague is the same disease it 
was back in the Dark Ages," said 
Guy Moore of Austin, team leader 
for the health department's plague 
surveillance. "The difference is that 
our knowledge and treatment have 
changed. Our sanitation is better, 
and we have antibiotics."

Moore was quick to point out 
that the risk to the general public is 
small. Nevertheless, individuals do 
contract the deadly disease, 
primarily through contact with 
animal carriers.

Three human cases of plague 
have been reported in Texas over 
the past 12 years. A fourth case 
involved a rancher form New 
Mexico who contracted the disease 
in Texas.

People in two of the cases, a 
hunter from Ector County and the 
New Mexico residents, died because 
the disease was not diagnosed as 
plague. The other West Texas 
residents, received timely medical 
attention and survived.

The disease usually occurs in 
human as a result of a bite by an 
infected flea or by handling an 
infected animal, Moore said.

Bubonic plague is the most 
common form of the disease in 
man. It gets its name from the 
bubo, or lump, that occurs in the 
groin, armpits, or occasionally, the 
back.

Symptoms appear usually within 
2 to 6 days after exposure and 
include a white coating on the 
tongue, fever, rapid pulse, and 
nervousness.

Left untreated, bubonic plague is 
fatal in about 60 percent of the 
cases. The disease happens so 
rarely that physicians may confuse 
it with meningitis, venereal 
disease, or influenza. Prompt 
treatment is highly effective.

The plague swept through large 
regions of the world at least three 
times in the last 1,500 years, each 
time killing millions. More than 
100 million people died of plague 
in Arabia an Egypt in 542 A.D. 
The disease became known as the 
Black Death when it swept across 
Europe in the 14th century, killing 
25 million people, or one-third of 
the population. The first known 
U.S. epidemic occurred in 1900 in 
San Francisco and killed 118 
people.

Plague-infected rodents have been 
found in 14 western stales, as far 
east as Texas, Oklahoma, and 
Kansas, and northward to Alberta, 
Canada.

The health department has been 
working since 1977 with the Texas 
Animal Damage Control Service to 
monitor the disease, which spread 
from New Mexico into West Texas 
during the 1970's and has been 
found as far east as Erath County 
near Dallas-Ft. Worth.

With this last outbreak, Moore 
said, "it is definitely moving east 
and will continue to move east." 
Pet owners, especially in the 
Abilene area, urged to be vigilant 
about flea control on their pets and 
in their yards and homes. Hunters 
and campers should be wary of 
cleaning infected animals or setting 
up tents near rodent burrows.

Coleman Young, mayor of De­
troit:

"I'll run for reelection if I want 
to," speaking on 75th birthday.

Jesse Helms, U.S. senator (R- 
N.C.):

"She (Roberta Achtenberg) is 
the showpiece of the homosexual 
movement," speaking of 58-31 
confirmation of admitted lesbian 
to high-level Clinton Administra­
tion post (which Helms opposed).

High School Students Receive Awards—(Back L-R) Andy Wilson, FFA; Chad McCormick,English 111; 
John Villalobos, Ag Coop; (Middle L-R) Steven Wauson, Honors Animal Science; Jason Barrett, Animal 
and Plant Science; (Front L-R) Rebecca Green, Honors English IV; Sonya Cisneros, English IV; Lisa 
Wilcox, Equine Science. (Journal Photo)

Cancer Information Center 
Awarded $4.74 Million
Whether it's 9 a.m. in El Paso 

or Oklahoma City, telephones at 
the Cancer Information Service 
(CIS) begin ringing each Monday 
through Friday until it's 4:30 p.m. 
in Brownsville or Tulsa.

And thanks to National Cancer 
Institute (NCI) funding, the six 
CIS telephone lines will ring non­
stop into 1997.

The NCI, the federal 
government's primary caner 
research agency, awarded The 
University of Texas M.D. 
Anderson Cancer Center a $4.74 
million contract to continue 
operation of this successful public 
education program based in 
Houston.

The CIS at M.D. Anderson 
Cancer Center is one of 19 regional 
offices located at NCI-designated 
Comprehensive Cancer Centers, 
such as M.D. Anderson, and other 
major hospitals across the U.S. It 
will serve the 20 million residents 
of Texas and Oklahoma.

"1 am extremely pleased to see 
that this successful and important 
program has received the support 
and acknowledgement it so richly 
deserves," said U.S. Rep. Mike 
Andrews, D-Houston. "An 
educational and informative 
program such as this is one of the 
vital keys to increasing public 
understanding of this most feared 
disease."

The CIS provides access to 
state-of-the-art cancer information 
in English and Spanish through its 
telephone service and community

prevention, detection, diagnosis, 
treatment and rehabilitation. NCI 
publications written in English and 
Spanish also are mailed free to the 
caller as a follow-up to the 
discussion with the information 
specialist.

To help callers address the 
physical, financial and emotional 
challenges presented by the disease, 
the CIS maintains a resource 
directory of more than 3,000 
cancer-related services and programs 
in Texas and Oklahoma.

"One of the great things about 
the program is that we he'p callers 
locate resources for assistance in 
their own community," said Jo 
Ann Ward, CIS coordinator. 
"Cancer is one of the most difficult 
challenges a person can face in life. 
We strive to help callers make the 
ordeal less stressful."

To help residents learn how to 
prevent cancer or detect the disease 
early when treatment is most 
successfu l, CIS outreach 
coordinators work with private and 
public health care agencies and the 
media to promote educational 
messages and materials which 
address specific cancer problems in 
their geographic region. Special 
efforts target high-risk populations 
including African American, 
Hispanics and Native Americans.

More than 315,000 callers from 
all backgrounds have called the CIS 
since its inception at M.D. 
Anderson 16 years ago. CIS 
community outreach programs, 
such as health fairs and community

presentations, have reached another 
129,000 people since 1976.

Nationwide, the CIS responds to 
more than 500,000 requests 
annually for cancer information. 
The majority of calls to 1-800-4- 
CANCER come from cancer 
patients, their family and friends, 
health care professionals and the 
general public. The CIS staff uses a 
variety of resources to respond to 
inquiries, including NCI's 
Physician Data Query data base of 
current information on the early 
detection and standard treatment of 
cancer. The data base also provides 
a nationwide listing of NCI- 
approved clinical trials that study 
new ways of treating cancer and 
may provide patients with more 
options.

As important as the information 
is, callers also find support from 
the information specialists to 
whom they speak. As one woman 
form Garland, Texas, wrote in a 
thank-you letter to the CIS, "I 
want to send you special thanks for 
your care and concern. It meant a 
lot to me to have someone 
LISTEN and give me some calm 
advice.”

All Wrong
"Pardon me, sir," in­

terrupted the lovely lady,
"but you're wearing you 
marriage ring on the 
wrong finger."

"I know," groaned the 
unhappy young man, "I 
married the wrong 
woman."

***
The trouble with mod­

em life is that it takes too 
much time.

outreach programs.
By dialing 1-800-4-CANCER, 

callers in the two states are 
connected automatically to the CIS 
in Houston. Information specialists 
answer questions on cancer

^  > CALL 
HEALTH h

INSURANCE P  re 's”,l
*1M* MkIM

Motu* lu lO f f l tM
m urantt  com©*** 

►writ Off**

Dr. A.R. Ploudre
Optom etrist

Family Vision Care Contact Lens 
Texas & New Mexico Medicaid 

*  Announcing, New Program of Special Assistance to 
-  Provide Vision Care to Low Income Families - 

Call For Information
505-762-2951 1515 Gidding St., Clovis, N.M.

' Credit Arrangement Available Upon Prior Approval

Grand Slant Savings!]
L
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Check Us For Your 
Baseball Equipment 

Bats - Balls - Gloves

i ‘*|

We Have Your Fishing 
Equipment Needs 

»  In Stock
'r Rods - Reels - Hooks 

Lines - Sinkers - Floats 
Etc

We Also Have A Good Selection of Tennis Rackets 
Soccer Balls - Basketballs 

Be Sure To Check With Us For All Your 
Sporting Needs!
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S tate  A Capital

HIGHLIGHTS
By Lyndell Williams 

»n<l Eli Sterllnn
TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION

AUSTIN — With Slate Treasurer 
Kay Bailey Hutchison going to 
Washington as Texas’ junior U.S. 
Senator, Comptroller John Sharp 
said last week the time is right 
to make state government more 
efficient by merging the treasury 
with his office.

It’s not a new idea. Lt. Gov. 
Bob Bullock suggested it almost 
IS years ago when he was state 
comptroller. And auditors on two 
occasions suggested to Sharp that 
the offices should be merged.

Sharp said be rejected the recom­
mendations because he didn’t want 
to be accused of engaging in parti­
san politics. Sharp is a Democrat; 
Hutchison is a Republican.

Sharp said be and Gov. Ann 
Richards recently discussed merg­
ing the agencies. “Ann asked me, 
if Krueger doesn't win, how many 
folks it would take to operate the 
state treasury. We could cut it 75 
percent, probably more.”

But the suggestion received a 
cold reception from Hutchison, 
who called the treasury “the most 
efficient agency in state govern­
ment. The state treasury was set 
up as a constitutional office by 
our founding fathers because they 
understood our system of checks

and balances — even if our state 
comptroller doesn’t.”

Since the treasury is established 
in the Constitution, abolishing it 
would require a two-thirds vote by 
the House and Senate and approval 
from Texas voters.

With the defeat of Bob Krueger, 
Richards’ interim appointee to the 
U.S. Senate, she must decide who 
will replace Hutchison. Whoever 
she appoints will have to run for 
re-election next year.

Meanwhile, the names of some 
of the governor’s close friends sur­
faced last week as possible replace­
ments for Hutchison. They include 
Mary Beth Rogers, Richards’ for­
mer chief of staff and a former 
deputy treasurer; Cathy Bonner, 
executive director of Ihe Texas De­
partment of Commerce; P»m Reed, 
a member of the Texas Water Com­
mission; and Mary Scott Nabers, 
Krueger’s successor on the Texas 
Railroad Commission; and Paul 
Williams, Richards’ current chief 
of staff.

Bush Eyes Governor’s Race
George W. Bush, the former 

president’s oldest son, may chal­
lenge Gov. Richards when she tries 
for a second term next year.

“Put me down as interested,” 
Bush told The Dallas Morning 
News recently. “She’s got a high 
personality cult following, and 
she’s funny and witty and charming 
at times,” he said, but added that 
Richards has yet to be challenged 
on tough issues.

The managing general partner of 
the Texas Rangers, said another 
consideration is whether or not his 
brother Jeb Bush enters Florida’s 
gubernatorial race.

Governor Vetoes Gun Bill
Surrounded by two people para­

lyzed by gunshot wounds and uni­
formed police officers, Gov. Ann 
Richards vetoed the controversial 
concealed weapons bill four days

after lawmakers went home.
Proponents of the measure said 

the governor’s action likely will 
be remembered in her re-election 
campaign.

By the time the bill reached 
Richards’ desk it simply called for 
a non-binding public vote on the 
right to carry a concealed weapon.

“This bill would spend $60,000 
to do a public opinion poll for 
gun interests. 1 cannot in good 
conscience waste taxpayer dollars to 
conduct a poll that will accomplish 
nothing and diverts attention from 
the real issues of crime such as drug 
abuse and prison overcrowding, ” 
Richards said.

But a House author of the mea­
sure promised to resurrect the bill 
in the 1995 legislative session. 
“It’s an issue that is not going to 
go away, ” said Rep. Bill Carter, R- 
Haltora City.

Carter also disputed the gov­
ernor’s estimate tlut the referen­
dum would cost $60,000. The vote 
would have, ner.urred on the regu­
lar Nov. 2 election day so it would 
simply have required adding a line 
to the ballot, he said.

“ Killer’’ Bee List Grows
Presidio County has been added 

to a list of 52 counties under a 
bee quarantine after the discovery 
of Africanized bees there.

A swarm of the “killer” bees was 
found in a trap near Marfa. Fed­
eral agriculture officials later con­
firmed the bees were Africanized. 
Beekeepers may not move hives out 
of the quarantine area.

Other Highlights
■ State Comptroller John Sharp 

praised the Texas Legislature for 
approving 85 percent of the sav­
ings proposed in his “Against the 
Grain” report. Sharp said the sav­
ings will total $3.8 billion over the 
next two years.

■ Nearly 20 percent of American 
homeowners have refinanced their

THESE LOOK UKE FUN— During the Toy Show held Saturday these two boys examine the various 
tractors and equipment. (Journal Photo) •u'.
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mortgages in the past IS months 
and an additional 14 percent are 
considering the move, according to 
a survey by the Federal National 
Mortgage Association.

■ Joe Betsy Allred, 87, wife 
of former Gov. James V. Allred, 
died last week in a Wichita Falls 
hospital after a brief illness. Gov. 
Allred, who was elected in 1935, 
died in 1959 while serving as a 
U.S. district judge.

■ Texas banks posted record first- 
quarter earnings of $863 million, 
second-highest in the nation, the 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corp. 
said. Only New York banks, at $1.9 
billion, had higher earnings.

SPC Second Summer 
Registration Dates 

Announced
Registration for the second 

summer term at South Plains 
College will be July 8.

Sign-up on the SPC Levelland 
campus is 2-7 p.m in the SPC 
Student Center.

Enrollment on the SPC 
Lubbock campus will be 9 a.m.-l 
p.m. and 4-6 p.m. that day.

Classes begin July 12. Late 
registration is scheduled 8:30 a.m.- 
3:30 p.m. and 5:30-6:30 p.m July 
12 or the Levelland campus, and 8 
a.m.-l p.m. and 4-6 p.m. that day 
on the Lubbock campus. A $10 
late registration fee will be charged.

July 13 is the last day to register 
or add classes. Classes end Aug. 
12.

Courses offered during the 
second five-week summer term on 
the Levelland campus include those 
in accounting, anthropology, 
biology, chemistry, English, 
governm ent, h isto ry , law 
e n fo rc e m e n t tec h n o lo g y , 
m a th e m a tic s , p e tro leu m  
technology, physical education, 
psychology, sociology, Spanish 
and speech communication.

Courses offered on the Lubbock 
campus include those in chemical 
abuse c o u n se lin g , child  
development, computer information 
systems, economics, English, 
h is to ry , legal a ss is ta n t, 
management, mathematics, new 
student orientation, sociology and 
speech communication.

Summer bulletins listing full 
course schedules for the summer 
can be obtained by contacting the 
SPC registrar’s office at 806-894- 
9611 in Levelland or 747-0576 in 
Lubbock.

Drug W ar Choice
President Clinton 

chose Lee Brown, a vet­
eran big-city police offi­
cial to head the drug war, 
praising his sensitivity to 
human concerns and "ex­
traordinary record of in­
novation in crime reduc­
tion."

***
Careful drivers never 

know when they save 
their own lives.

Life would be more en­
joyable if you tried to en­
joy it.

Do a favor for someone 
each day and become a 
rich person.

An opportunity whose potential 
is defined by your ambition!

Avon
THE SMARTEST OPPORTUNITY IN TOWN

Gall Today! 272-5607
Avon Indapandont Salt* I

ENW -Ty\

EAST WIND 
WEST WIND

Pearl Buck—  The woman who embraced the world.

In December, 1938, a radio broad­
cast from Stockholm sped some 
surprising news around the world. That 
year, the Nobel Committee’s coveted 
prize for literature was awarded to 
American-born author Pearl 
Sydenstrickcr Buck. With this 
announcement, the 46-ycar-old author 
stepped into an international spotlight, 
eventually becoming one of the most 
popular American authors of all time. 
Pearl Buck still holds the distinction of 
being the only American woman ever 
to receive the Nobel Prize for 
literature.

East Wind, West Wind is a 90

minute documentary film chronicling 
the rich and dynamic life of Pearl S. 
Buck, who used her fame as a writer to 
call attention to many important issues 
of her day.

East Wind, West Wind follows 
the path of a missionary child, bom in 
West Virginia at the tum of the century 
and raised in rural China, who became 
one of the most popular writers of the 
20th century. A blend of oral history 
and historical footage forms an 
intimate and intriguing portrait of this 
multifaceted woman.

East W ind, West Wind airs 
Wednesday, June 23rd at 8:00 p.m.

Green G old:
FROM THE MAYA TO THE MOON

Green Gold: From the Maya to 
the Moon traces the phenomenal 
influence of the three New World 
treasures — com. potatoes, and chile 
peppers — on human history. These 
plants from the Americas have played 
major roles in both nurturing and 
undermining entire societies. Green 
Gold also highlights ongoing efforts to 
preserve and promote their precious 
genetic diversity, seen by many as a 
requirement for global food security.

In the past, overdependence on food 
crops with a narrow genetic base has 
had disastrous consequences. The Irish 
potato famine, the United States’ com 
blight and massive chile wilts, and the 
sudden disappearance of the Mayan 
civilization, possibly due to a failure of 
the com crop, all serve as painful

reminders that we must not allow 
history to repeat itself. Today, “new 
explorers’’ are looking at the original 
sources of com, potatoes, and chile in 
hopes of finding genetic clues that 
might help ensure a stable food supply 
for ourselves and our children.

Green Gold highlights the life’s 
work of internationally recognized 
plant explorers, molecular geneticists, 
anthropologists, authors, and 
ethnobotanists. Paul Bosland, New 
Mexico State University plant breeder, 
is featured in the documentary as he 
hunts for wild chile varieties in 
Guatemala.

Green Gold: From the Maya to
the Moon airs Wednesday, June 23rd 
at 9:30 p.m. It will repeat Sunday, June 
27th at 12:00 noon.

Hasten New Mexico University, Policies, New Mexico

• Antiques • Apartments
• Automobiles • Baby Carraiges

• Bargains • Bric-A-Brac 
• Child Care • Condominiums

• Co-ops • Contractors
• Domestic Help • Estate Sales

• Flea Markets • Furniture
• Garage Sales

• Help Wanted • Houses 
• Merchandise • Personals • Pets

• Rides To Work • Rentals 
Rooms To Let • Situations Wanted

• Summer Shares

GET ON 
A ROLL WITH 

CLASSIFIEDS!
Muleshoe & Bailey County

Journals
272-4536
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CLASSIFIED
RATES

15 Words & Under 
Minimum Charge

$2.30
Thereafter

$2.00
16 Words & over

1st Insertion 
15 cents per word 

2nd Insertion 
13 cents per word

CLA SSIFIED  
DISPLAY RATES

$1.75
Per Column Inch

DEADLINES
12 noon Tues.

For Thursday Paper 
12 noon Friday 

For Sunday Paper

To receive the reduced 
rate after the first 

insertion, ad must run 
continously.

We reserve the right to 
classify, revise, or reject 

any ad. We are not 
responsible for any error 

a^ter^adjiasj^un^

4. Houses [8 . Real E sta te^ . Real E sta te | 8. Real E sta te |8 . Real Estate|8. Real Estate|8. Real Estate 
For Rent

For more information and 
assistance regarding the 
investigation of get-rich- 
quick, work-at-home and 
other financial/business 
opportunities. The Mul£- 
shoe and Bailey County 
Journals urges its readers 
to contact the Better 
Business Bureau, 1206 
14th St., #901, Lubbock, 
TX 79401 or call 
(806)763-0459.

1. Personals
Exterior and Interior 

Painting. Experienced- 
Clean and Neat. 

Reasonable Rates- 
Free Estimates. 

Call: 
272-4012

Hl-23t-8tc
----  _ * * *

CLEAN  
M A C H IN E S! 

Two college girls want 
summer cleaning jobs. 
We'll make your house 

Sparkle!
References Available.

... Call: 272-5922 
***

1 am no longer 
responsible for any debts 

other than my own, 
James (Jesse) 

Cunningham as of June 
13, 1993.

3. Help 
Wanted

Applications are being 
taken for relief sales 
clerk. Apply in person. 
Muleshoe Fina - 102 W. 
American Blvd. Phone: 
272-5278.
M3-25t-3tc

* * *

IMM EDIATE 
OPENINGS 

Trimming photograph 
without prior experience 
make up to $350.00 per 

week. Call now 
1-800-685-9303. 

S3-25t-20tc
* * *

Need outside 
commissions sales 

people in 
Muleshoe Area. 

KERC 107.5 FM 
Radio Station. 

Apply at 4901 N. Prince 
in Clovis jt  phone 
Janet Patterson at 
(505)763-7109.

4. Houses 
For Rent

FOR RENT:
3 Bedroom, 2 Bath 
Trailer for details call 
806-481-3200 ask for 
Gay.

3 bedroom house for rent 
903 W. 8th. Call Gerad 

Bizzcll in Olton at 
806-285-2757. 

B4-25t-tfc

For rent 2 Bedrm. 1-Bath 
1020 S. 1st - 

$220.00/month 
Pick your color carpet for 
living room w/1 yr. lease 

806-745-3134 (collect) 
After 5:30 pm M-F 

Anytime on weekends. 
***

Small 2 bedroom home. 
References required. 

Inquire at
1918 W. Birch Ave.

5. Apts.
For Rent

Apartm ent For Rent
Good Location, Water 
Paid, Call 272-7575

11. For Sale 
or Trade

FOR SALE:
Gas Patio Grill. 
Good. 272-5169.

* * *

Spinet- Console piano 
for sale. Take on small 
payments. See locally.

1-800-343-6494.
1 l-24s-2tp

______________ __ ___

HENRY REALTY
111 W. AVE. B 272-4581

M u lesh oe, Tx.
Lenau Addition-4 bedroom, 2 bath, carport, central heat 
and air, carpet, dining area, built-in dishwasher and 
stove. Covered patio, wood fence, storm doors and 
windows, drapes and curtains. One ceiling fan. Ample 
storage and shed for travel trailer.

* * *

RURAL-3 bedroom, 1 bath, 2 car garage, masonite 
siding, carpet throughout, central heat, evap. air cond. 
on roof ducted to all rooms. Built-in dishwasher. New 
roof. Additional acres available, owner financing to 
qualified buyer.

* * *

2 bedroom, 1 bath, detached 2 car garage, extra lot and
well for garden. Country Club Addition.

* * *

New listing-2 bedroom, 1 bath, redone for qualified 
buyer.

* * *

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY
Ideal location on West American Blvd. 150' highway
frontage. A great business opportunity.

* * *

West American Boulevard 150' frontage. Priced to sell. 
LAND

160 acres irrigated farm land with pivot sprinkler SW of 
Muleshoe. 60 acres of wheat. Ideal for livestock 
operation. Good water.

Nieman Realty
116 E. Ave. C George Nieman, Broker 272-5286 or 272-5285

CHECK WITH US FOR AVAILABLE HUD PROPERTIES!!!!!

13. Property 
For Lease

Texaco Service Station 
For Lease Contact: 

Morrison Oil Company 
806-272-4688 

Ml3-19t-18tc

15. Misc.
Major Appliance 
and Minor -Home 

Repairs!
C all 272-4450

HENDERSON 
[SERVICE, CO.|

ONE DAY SALE 
Saturday, June 19th 

9 a.m. - 706 W. Ave. K 
Furniture, linens, 

clothes, pots and pans, 
decorating items.

Home For Sale
901 Juniper 3-2 Brick, 

$42,000 FHA qualifying 
Assumable.

Days 293-3888,
Nights 293-9706 

G8-12s-tfc
* * *

FOR SALE  
2100 sq. ft. 4 bedroom 
brick with new timber- 
line roof. Total electric-3 
year old heat pump-(heat 
& cool). 2 baths, double 
garage, lots of closets. 
Call 272-4793 or 5531.

* * *

House for sale
302 Chicago 

2- 1-1
$16,500.00 

Call Don 
892-3158. 

8-24s-4tp **•

HOME FOR SALE 
3-1-1 Brick, Heat Pump,1 

Fence, Trees 
(just planted); FmHA 

Financing, 808 W. 9th.
272-5687

W8-19s-12tc
BUILDING LOT BY 

OWNER
Beautiful Park Ridge 
Addition-Muleshoe.

103' X 125’
paved street, utilities. 
Great View! Consider 
rade-in or owner financ­
ing. For information— 

(806) 795-5409 
W8- lOs-tfc

* * ¥

3-2-1 house for sale. 
Reasonable price, fenced 
yard. 1521 W. Ave. B. 

Phone: 272-3224 
C8-15t-tfc

- 1

i » 
1 3

RICHLAND HILLS
NICE RESIDENTIAL LOTS...$5,000 UP

JUST LISTED-Nice 3-1 3/4-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, 
built-ins, fenced yard. $40’s!!i!!!RH-1

3-2-1 Brick, Cent A&H, with fenced yard... 
$50's!!!!!!RH-6

3-2-2 Brick with fireplace, 5 ceiling fans, new 
carpet & paint, new dual fuel heat pump, 
abundance of closet space...$90's....RH-8

HIGH SCHOOL
3-1-1 Brick, Cent, heat, evap. air.
FmHA financing. $20's!!!!!HS-l

IMMACULATE LARGE BRICK HOME 3-2-2 
Heat Pump, built-ins. Whirlpool, loads of 
storage, lg. shop-storage, $70's!!! HS-2

PRICE REDUCED 3-2 Remodeled, 
heat pump, built-ins, fenced yd., 

storage bldg. $23,000!! HS-3

JUST LISTED-3-2 Home Cent. A&H, built-ins, 
fans, st. bldg., fenced yd. $30’s!!!HS-5

JUST LISTED-Nice 3-1-1 Home, floor & wall 
furnace heat, window ref. air, DW, fans, storage- 

workshop, cellar, & more..$30’s!!!!!!HS-6 
3-2-1 Bricky P v f  built-ins.

JUST LISTED-Nice 3-1 3/4 bath home, ft. 
furnace, evap. air, fenced yard. $20's!!!!!HS-7

NICE 3-1-1 Brick, 1 g o ld  mP- built-ins & more!!!!
HIGHLAND AREA

3-2-1 Brick, Cent. A&H, FP, built-ins.
MAKE OFFER!!!! HL-1 

NICE 3-2-2 Brick, Cent. A&H, built-ins, FP, 
sunroom, auto, spklr., fenced yd., MORE!! 

$70's!!!! HL-2
FmHA Financing To Qualified buyer- -NICE 
3-1-1 Brick Home, Cent. A&H, ceiling fans, 

storage bldg,, fenced yd. $30’s!f!!HL-3 
3-2-1 Brick, Cent, heat, evap. air, built-ins, 

fenced yd., storage bldg. $40K.. HL-4

LENAU ADDITION 
PRICE REDUCED-3-1 1/2-1 Home, Cent, 

heat, evap. air, cov. patio, st. bldg., 
fenced yd. $30'sl!l L-l 

REMODELED BRICK-3-2-1 With Cent, 
heat, built-ins—PRICE REDUCED!!L-2

JUST LISTED-2-1-1 Home with Heat Pump, 
has extra insulationin attic & floors...$20's....L-4

3-2-1+carport, Brick, ceiling fans, Approx. 2060 
sq. ft...$40's!! L-6 

RURAL HOMES
NICE 3-2-2 carport Home, one acre tract. Cent 

A&H, built-ins, fenced, on pavement close 
to town. $40's!H HR-2 

4-3 Bath, Brick, on 2 acres, built-ins, FP, 
Geothermal Ht. pump, horse stalls, pens & tack rm. 
Also income producting shop on location or use for 

your own needs . $60'sl! PRICE REDUCEDl!!!
VERY NICE 4-2-2 Brick home on 6 ac., Cent. 
A&H, 2300'+lv. area, Much More!! $70’s!HR-4

3-2-2 Brick, bit.-ins, Ht. pump, FP, 2.5 acres 
on pavement. $60*8!!! HR-3
NICE 3A 1 

do’
>n 40 acres 

wn!!H!
3-2-3 Carport Mobile home on 11 ac. edge of 

town, MAKE OFFER!!! HR-5

3-2-1 on 1 acre, Cent. Heat, Evap. Air, 
Remodeled, $30's!! HR-6

3-1-2 Home on 1 1/2 acres storm cellar & 
storage bldg..,$20’s!!!! HR-8

ASK ABOUT OUR COMMERCIAL LISTINGS!!!

Circle Back Area-177 acres of good dryland... 
Fully Allotted!!!

PLEASANT VALLEY-160 acres, 8" well. 
_____ LIriggey circle!!!!!

9. Automobiles 9. Automobiles 
For Sale For Sale

CLOSET TO 
CLOSET 
107 E. 3rd

Up-to-date used clothes. 
OPEN:

Wed., Thurs., Fri., 
from 1 pm to 5 pm. 

Saturdays 10 am to 5 pm

*  S i r i u s  V J U ,  »

Door, Automatic Transmission, Air Conditioning, 
Power Mirrors, Power Windows, Power Door Locks, 
Power Seat, AM/FM Stereo Cassette, No Old Contract 
To Assume, No Back Payments To Make, Just need 
responsible party to make reasonable monthly 
payments, call Doug Bolt in the Credit Dept.,
FRIONA MOTORS 806/247-2701

l-24s-2tc
GARAGE SALE 
Saturday, June 19th 

9 a.m. - 5 p.m. 
Baby bed, rowing 

machine, love seat, light 
fixtures, clothing, and 

miscellaneous.
1915 W. Ave. H,

MUJ>f S £ L L !  93 OLDSMOBILE CUTLASS 
SUPREME, 4-Door Sedan, Power Seat, Power 
Windows, Power Door Locks, Tilt Steering Wheel, 
Cruise Control, AM-FM Stereo Cassette, Rear Window 
Defroster, No Old Contract To Assume, No Back 
Payments To Make, Just need responsible party to 
make reasonable monthly payments, call Doug 
Hulderman in the Credit Dept.,
FRIONA MOTORS 806/247-2701

ROUND-UP 
APPLICATION 

Pipe-wick mounted on 
high-boy. 30 in. or 40 
in. rows. Cotton, milo, 
soybeans and Vol. com. 
Call:

Roy O'Brian 
265-3247 

KILLS FLEAS!
Buy ENFORCER Flea 

Killers for pets, home & 
yard. Guaranteed 

effective! Available at: 
Scoggin Ag Center 

1532 W. American Blvd. 
15-21 t-20tp(TS)

SEPTIC TANK 
BACKED UP?

Use ENFORCER Septic 
Tank Treatment to 

Prevent Back-up, Foul 
Odors and to Keep Your 

System Working 
Properly. 

Available at: 
Scoggin Ag Center 

1532 W. American Blvd.- 
15-2 It- 16tp(TS)

v - * > • -  .
KILL ROACHES! 
Buy ENFORCER 

OvcrNite Roach Spray. 
Kills roaches overnight 

or your money back; 
GUARANTEED!

Available at: 
Scoggin Ag Center 

1532 W. American Blvd. 
1:. ?!t-19tp(TS)

MUST SE LL 92 BUICK LESABRE, 4-Door, 
Power Windows, Power Door Locks, Cruise Control, 
Tilt Steering Wheel, AM/FM Stereo Cassette, No old 
contract to assume, no back payments to make. Just 
need responsible party to make reasonable monthly 
payments, call Doug Hulderman in the Credit Dept., 
FRIONA MOTORS_______________ 806/247-2701

18. Legals |  18. Legals

[ 18. Legals
Notice is hereby given 
th a t L e tte rs  of 30
Administration for the 
E sta te  of L illie  
Barnhouse McMahan, 
Deceased, were issued on 
June 15, 1993, in cause

CD
0)
CL

number 1935 pending in il l
the County Court of

e e y

Bailey County, Texas, to 
Charles Barnhouse. The 
residence of such 
administrator is P.O. Box

CD
o

:343, Milton-Frecwater. 
’Oregon 97862. The post 0)

COxjffice address for
submitting claims is: CO

,. c/o Gordon H. Green mmmm...»
P.O. Box 442 ""fl

Muleshoe, Texas 79347 CD
All persons having 
claims against this estate Q.

COwhich is currently being
administered are required
to present them within
the time and in the 
manner prescribed by
law. Dated this 15th day <
of June, 1993. mGordon H. Green 

Attorney for the Estate
Notice to Creditors -
Page solo 
G18-25t-ltc

w

354 ac. S. of town, good allot. &
_________ yields!!!!_________

CLASSIFY; Call 272-4536- Classify!

MULESHOE AREA 
HOSPITAL DISTRICT 

Board of Directors will 
accept bids for the 
r e p l a c e m e n t  of  
sterilization equipment. 
Specifications may be 
obtained from the office 
of the Administrator, 
Muleshoe Area Medical 
Center, 708 S. First St., 
Muleshoe, Texas 79347. 
All bids must be received 
by July 21, 1993. The 
Board reserves the right' 
to reject any and all bids.
M18-25t-ltc

* * *

NOTICE .JQ
CREDITO RS 

NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that the original 
Letters Testamentary of 
the Estate of NORA 
MAE GASTON were 
issued to BERNARD O. 
GASTON, a resident of 
Bethany, Oklahoma, on 
the 12th day of March, 
A.D., 1993.

All persons having 
claims against the estate 
o f NORA MAE 
GASTON, are hereby 
required to present same 
to BERNARD O. 
GASTON at 7223 N.W. 
46th Street, Bethany, 
Oklahoma 73008, within 
the time required-by law. 

LOUIS M. (MICKEY) 
RATLIFF JR. 

Attorney at Law 
P.O. Box 888 

Littlefield. TX 79339 
Telephone No. (806) 

385-3302
Telecopier No. (806) 

385-4518
State Bar No. 16577000

R18-25t-ltc
* • *

NOTICE TO ALL 
PERSONS HAVING 
CLAIMS AGAINST 
THE ESTATE QE 

LILLIE
BARNHOUSE
MCMAHAN.
DECEASED

HEAT 
GOTCHA? 
SHOP THE 
COOL
CLASSIFIED,
WAY!

For sale items make a 
big splash when adver­
tised in the Classifieds! 
Read ’em, use 'em!

Muleshoe
Journal

Classifieds!
Bigger and Better 

Than Ever 
272-4536

ENW-T

Sissy Spacek and William Hurt in

“Verna: USO Girl”
G reat P erfo rm ances begins 

winding down its gala 20th 
Anniversary Season with a special 
encore presentation of one of its most 
popular productions: 1978’s “Verna: 
USO Girl.” Filmed on location in 
Hammelberg and Baumholder, 
Germany, the telecast stars Sissy 
Spacek and William Hurt and is based 
on Paul Gallico’s celebrated World 
War II short story.

Spacek is unforgettable as Verna, a 
rather untalcnted young girl who 
dreams of being a star. She joins a 
second-rate USO troupe headed by 
Howard Da Silva and Sally Kellcrman, 
a Catskill comic and smokey-voiccd

chanteuse, respectively. Verna 
clumsily sings and dances her way into 
the hearts of the Armed Forces behind 
enemy lines. Vema is everybody’s 
favorite — particularly the favorite of 
a handsome young captain, played by 
William Hurt, who wants to marry her.

“Vema: USO Girl” was aided by the 
USO and the US Army. Hundreds of 
GIs stationed in Germany are featured 
in the telecast, as are a group of World 
War II standards, including “I’ll Get 
By,” "You’ll Never Know," and “Since 
You Went Away," which are sung by 
the cast and integrated into the action.

Great Performances “Vema: USO 
Girl" will be broadcast Wednesday, 
June 16th at 8:00 p.m. on KENW-TV.

“La Carpa”
"Vengan a la carpa!" ,rVengan Todos!"

"Come to the tent show!" "Come 
all!"

Shouted noisily through the streets, 
the above “convite” (invitation) is 
announced to the townspeople to come 
and see the “carpa" performed on a 
makeshift stage beneath a small tent. In 
the first half of this century, “carpa” 
troupes roamed the U.S. Southwest, 
stopping in small towns to perform 
vaudeville acts for Mexican and 
Chicano laborers and their families. 
The family-run “carpas" offered 
colorful entertainment along with 
traditional songs and poetry, weaving 
these together around the “pelado” 
character, a Chicano/M exican

cveryman similar to Charlie Chaplin's 
tramp.

But even more im portant, the 
“carpas" provided a unique medium for 
exploring the political and social 
problems experienced by the local 
community. The “carpas" crafted a 
bicultural. bilingual sensibility that 
celebrated the ethnic diversity of the 
U.S. Southwest.

Set in 1938, the film explores racial 
tensions in the Southwest, while it 
reveals the mediating role of the 
"carpa."

"La Carpa" on American 
Playhouse will be broadcast 
Wednesday. June 16th at 9:30 p.m.

Fasten New Mexico University, PorUstes, New Mexico
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A Carrousel 
of Good Food

1902 W. Amer. Blvd. 
272-4131 

Closed Tuesdays

Special fa ther's  
D ay (Buffet

Reservations Welcome
New Summertime Evening Hours 

Open for Dinner - 5:30 To 9:30 
Beginning New Hours - June 9

$799.00

# 147-306
Hours: Mon.-Sat. 8 a.m. - 6 p.m. Sun. 1:30 p.m. - 4:30 p.m.

Fry & Cox
Lumber Hardware

401 S. 1st 272-4511

28 29 30 
53 54 55 
78 79 80 
103 104 105

31 32 33 34 35 
56 57 58 59 60 
61 82 83 84 85 
106 107 108 109 110

36 37 38 39 40 
61 62 63 64 65 
86 87 88 89 90

111 112 113 114 115

41 42 43 44 45
66 67 68 69 70 
91 92 93 94 95 

116 117 118 ’ 19 120

71 72 73 
96 97 98

12’ 122 123

128 129 130 
153 154 155 
178 179 180 
200 204 205 
228 229 230

131 132 133 134 135 
156 157 158 159 160 
181 162 183 184 185 
206 207 208 209 210 
231 232 233 234 235

136 137 138 139 140 
161 162 163 164 165 
186 187 188 189 190 
211 212 213 214 215 
236 237 238 239 240

141 14? 143 144 145 
166 167 168 169 170 
191 192 193 194 195 
216 217 218 219 220 
241 242 243 244 245

146 147 148 
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221 222 223 
246 247 248
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278 279 280 
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503 504 505 
528 529 530 
553 554 555 
578 579 580 
603 604 605

506 507 508 509 510 
531 532 533 534 535 
550 557 558 559 560 
581 582 583 584 585 
606 607 608 609

511 512 513 514 515 
536 537 538 539 540 
561 562 563 564 565 
586 587 588 589 590 
611 612 613 614 615

516 517 518 519 520 
541 542 543 544 545 
566 567 568 569 570 
591 592 5*3 594 595 
616 617 618 819 620

521 522 523 
546 547 548 
571 572 573 
596 597 598 
621 622 523

Wilson Drilling Co.
"Complete service from the bottom of the 

well to the bottom of the Glass"
Domestic * Irrigation * Test Holes

GOULDS 
WATER SERVICE

GOULDSWater
System s

♦INSURED * BONDED 
W. Hwy 8 4

2 7 2 - 5 5 2 1
TX LIC 02628W  NM WD1152

Dine In or Carry Out 
or Delivery

Delivery Available 
11 a.m. - 1:30 p.m.
& After 5:00 p.m.

1412 W. Amer. Blvd.

Big Foot Pizza 
21 S lices
lft x 2 ft Pizza 

v 1-3 Toppings

$ 1 0 . 9 9

H u t 272-4213

Kill Grubs 
With Oftanol

Spring Clearance Sale 
Still in Progress

Kristy’s Plants
710 E. Amer. Blvd. Muleshoe 272-5536

Remodeling Headquaters
Come in & let us help you with 

your Remodeling 
-Wallpaper - Carpet - Floor Tiles - 

- Fabric - Formica - Blinds- 
- Ceramic Tile-

Muleshoe Floor Covering
Curtis Carpenter 

122 S. Main 272-3555

CHIMICHANGA
(MEAT BURRITO)

Deep Fries, Topped with 
Bean Sauce and Cheese

$3.50
C losed  T u esd a y s

Viola fs Restaurant
2002 W. Amer. Blvd. 272-3838

Tunis Moralez, Mgr.

Pizza Hut has been open in 
Muleshoe since 1977. Tanis 
Moralez is manager with Mary 
Helen Orozco and Vicki Gonzales 
as assistant managers.

The Pizza Hut specializes in Pan, 
Thin-N-Crispy or Hand Tossed 
Traditional Pizzas with your choice 
of toppings.

They also serve delicious Hot 
Sandwiches, Spaghetti, Cavatini & 
Breadsticks.

They have a Super Salad & Soup 
Bar and your choice of coffee, tea 
or soft drinks.

Tanis, Mary Helen and Vicki 
invite you to come in and enjoy a 
delicious meal with them.

P to *H ut
1412 W. American Blvd. 272-4213

M uleshoe, Texas

ffenry 
Insurance Agency, 

Inc.
"Serving Your Insurance Needs Since 1964"

Kenneth Henry
Certified Insurance /  ~~S \ 111 W. Ave. B.

Counselor I /'y . -  j Phone 806-272-4581
Real Estate Broker '------ Muleshoe, Tx. 79347

Sudduth Field & Co.
David Sudduth, CPA 
Randall Field, CPA 

" A Complete Tax & General
Accounting Service ”

Auditing - State & Federal Income Taxes - 
Financial Statements - Payroll 

Bookkeeping • Financial Planning & Budgeting

104 W. 2nd. Muleshoe 272-4291

Lawn Fertilizer 
at it's 
Best

Designed For Our 
Sandy Area

Scoggin Ag. Center, ,
1532 W. Amer. Blvd. 272-4613
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BRYANT
SPECIAL

Bean and Meat Burrito with 
Chile & Cheese

$3.50
C losed  M ondays

Leal's Restaurant

Getting Ready 
for Company !

Let us help you with your 
cleaning of your Carpet, 

Upholstery & Drapes

Lambert Cleaners
1606 W. Amer. Blvo. 272-3294 123 Main 272-4726

Connie's Place
121 Main 272-3126

Hours:
Mon. - Fri. 5 a.m. - 4 p.m.
Sat. - 5:00 a.m. - 2:00 p.m.

Daily Buffet:
Includes Salad Bar & Cobbler 

Serving Breakfast Daily 
Connie Dominguez, Owner


