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In the Texas Dept, of Parks 
and Wildlife public hearing 
held at the Courthouse in 
Muleshoe on Monday, Feb­
ruary 6, changes which are 
porposed that would effect 
Bailey County include: an 
increase in the bag limit on 
pheasants, and the change 

L of quail season to end on the 
last Saturday in February, 
according to Justice of the 
Peace Jack Bates who at­
tended the meeting. Most of 
the changes involved were 
in the Fishing laws. How­
ever, Bailey County resi­
dents will be glad to know 
that there is no open season 
on squirrels in Bailey 

w County.
*****

Ski Break for the Mule­
shoe Schools will be observ­
ed on Friday, February 24 
and Monday February 27. 
School will resume on Tues­
day, February 28 at the 
regular time.

% Persons interested in be­
coming a member of 
"Weight-Watchers” are 
asked to call Betty Campbell 
at 272-4583 from 8 a.m. to 5 
p.m.

*****
There will be a Dutch 

Treat Luncheon for Retail 
Businessmen at 12:00 noon 
on Friday, February 10,

| i  1984 at the Corral Restau­
rant. The purpose of the 
Luncheon, which is being 
sponsored by the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture, is to discuss 
plans for the George Wash­
ington^ "Birthday Sale and 
other retail promotions. If 
there is sufficient interest 
shown by local merchants, it 

g  is expected that such meet­
ings will be held monthly.

*****
The AARP will have a 

special called meeting on 
Friday, at 2 p.m. at the 
Bailey County Civic Center. 
Superintendent of Schools, 
H- John Fuller will address 
the topic of longer hours in 
education. All citizens of 

\ Muleshoe are urged to 
attend this meeting, whet­
her members or not.

*****
If you have not filled out 

your response on the topic 
of ‘‘Longer Hours in Educa­
tion” , published in the 
Bailey County Journal on 
Sunday, February 5, you are 
urged to do so, and mail or 

I  drop them by the Journal 
office, as soon as possible. 
High School students are 
encouraged to participate, 
especially if they are of vot­
ing age.

Cont. Page 6, Col. 1

Ramin Named 
f Outstanding 

Woman In 1983
The Board of Advisors for 

the Outstanding Young Wo­
men of America awards pro­
gram has announced that 
Alta Pearlene Ramm, 
daughter, of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Ramm. has been sel-

ALTA RAMM
ected for inclusion in the 
1983 edition of OUT­
STANDING YOUNG WO­
MEN OF AMERICA.

The Outstanding Young 
Women of American pro­
gram is designed to honor 
and encourage exceptional 
young women between the 
ages of 21 and 36 who have 
Con’t Page 6, Col. 6

State Sales Tax Rebates 
Running 2.5% Ahead Of ’83

Economic Recovery 
Evident In Totals

★ ★ ★  ★ ★ ★

Chamber Manager Gives 
Rotary Events Preview

WORK UNDERWAY ON NEW BUILDING... Dirt work began Monday, February 6 on the new 
activity building at Dillman Elementary. Preliminary work should be finished this week. 
Estimated time of completion of the building by A&M Builders is two weeks. This building 
will provide a covered play area for Dillman students.

Five Area Telephone Coop 
Holds Annual Meeting

The Five Area Telephone 
Cooperative, Inc. held their 
annual membership meeting 
on Saturday, February 4 be­
ginning at 10 a.m. in the 
Five Area Warehouse build­
ing.

A financial report was 
given to the large number of 
members attending, which 
indicated a good year for the 
Cooperative for 1983.

The election of Directors 
from District 5, 6 and 7 was 
held, with incumbents, Bob 
Foley, Richard Black and 
Rex Griffiths being re-elect­
ed to serve through 1986. A 
nominating committee was 
also selected for Districts 2 
and 4 Directors for the 1985 
meeting. That committee 
consists of: from District 2, 
Steve Bell and Doyle Weir; 
from District 4: Lewis 
Wayne Shafer and Jerry 
Damron. Ray O’Brian was 
named Committee-man at 
large for the 1985 Nomin­
ating Committee.

Following the elections 
and various reports, Hubert 
Kidd, manager of the Five 
Area Telephone Coopera­
tive, Inc. gave a rundown on

the year of 1983 and what’s 
coming in the year of 1984 
in the industry. Kidd started 
out by stating that the Co­
operative had a good year in 
1983, and recognized all 
past directors for their help 
and aid in making the Co­
operative a well-run organi­
zation.

‘‘We really don’t know 
just where we stand with the 
problem of telephone dereg­
ulation. At this point, there 
have been so many changes 
we are hardpressed to keep 
up with them,” the manager 
said. ‘‘We are doing our 
best to try and understand 
the FCC regulations, and as 
soon as we know just what is 
going to happen, we will let 
the public know,” Kidd 
said.

Some highlights of the 
year were also pointed out 
for the Cooperative. Kidd 
said that general mainten­
ance had been working hard 
to replace cables, which had 
helped with a lot of prob­
lems. "We still have some, 
but we are working to cor­
rect them,” he said.

In 1983, the Cooperative

hired no outside help, 
according to the manager. 
All work was done by Co­
operative employees. New 
systems have been put in 
from Lehman to Bledsoe and
Con’t Page 6, Col. 3

The Muleshoe Rotary 
Cub met at noon an Tues­
day, February 7 for their 
regular weekly meeting in 
the Civic Center. Guests in­
cluded George Shelton, Her­
man Shelton, John Actkin- 
son, Dewayne Hammer, 
Dub Harlin, Larry Hancock 
and Joe Geer.

Two new members were 
installed into the organiza­
tion by President, Tim 
Campbell. Those new mem­
bers were Wayne Holmes 
and Sam Harlin.

The program was present­
ed by Doran Reynolds, who 
introduced Chamber of 
Commerce Manager, John 
Gulley.

Gulley gave the Rotarians 
a resume of forthcoming 
events in Muleshoe and 
Bailey County. Among them 
were the upcoming Cham­
ber Banquet which is is 
scheduled for March 29. 
Gulley reminded that tickets 
were S10 if purchased in ad­
vance and $12 on the day of

County 4-H Youth 
Place At Ft. Worth

Local Brothers Will 
Be In Calf Scramble

Chris Young, a 12 year 
old and his brother Greg 
Young, age 14, 4-H mem 
bers from Muleshoe, Texas, 
will participate in the 1984 
Houston Livestock Show and 
Rodeo calf scramble on Feb­
ruary 25 in the Astrodome. 
The calf scramble is an ex­
citing part of the rodeo 
action starring Merle Hag­
gard and Sylvia as part of 
that evening's performance.

Chris, and Greg, the sons 
of Mr. and Mrs. Jim Young, 
will compete for one of the 
280 calf purchase certifi­
cates to be awarded at the 
1984 Rodeo.

The Houston Livestock 
Show and Rodeo is the 
Southwest’s premier charity 
event, with all net proceeds 
directly benefiting youth 
and education. The calf 
scramble is just one of the 
many programs aiding 
young people. The Show is 
the nation’s largest donor of 
agricultural scholarships.

The calf scramble is a 
"year long” event that be­
gins with atheltic competi­
tion in the Astrodome and 
ends with qualitative comp­
etition in the show ring.

It involves the turning 
loose of two dozen or so 
energetic youngsters and 
half as many wild, young 
calves in one arena. Those 
who manage to grab a calf, 
halter it and drag it across 
the finish line are provided 
with a $600 calf purchase 
certificate. The certificate, 
donated by a sponsoring 
firm or individual, is used to 
purchase a purc-brcd, regis­
tered beef or dairy heifer.

The calf is raised by the 
winner for a special show 
ring competition to be held 
at next year’s show. In ac­
cordance with the general 
rules of the livestock show 
and the scramble program, 
each project is closely super­
vised by a vocational agri­
culture teacher or county 
extension agent. Controlled 
learning experiences include 
Cont. Page 6. Cot 4

Eight Bailey County 
4-H’ers showed their live­
stock projects at the South­
western Exposition and Fat 
Show in Fort Worth on 
Thursday and Friday, Feb­
ruary 2-3, coming out ‘‘real 
good in the placings,” ac­
cording to County Agent 
Spencer Tanksley.

Showing her Angues steer 
to a Grand Champion win in 
that division was Julie 
Claunch, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Pat Claunch of 
Bula. “ Stymie,” her winn­
ing steer was judged Thurs­
day and competed against 
1219 other entries. He was 
placed first in the Heavy 
Weight class, weighing 
about 1240 pounds, and was 
then named Grand Champ­
ion Angus of the show.

Tanksley stated that every 
steer taken to Fort Worth 
this year made the sale, and 
that was the best the county 
has ever done at this show. 
"In the cross breds, our kids 
were showing in classes 
where there were about 75 
entries per class, so the 
placings they received, we 
felt, were exceptionally 
good.”

Colin Tanksley, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Spencer 
Tanksley placed first in his

class with a light weight 
Polled Hereford steer.

Jodie Wheeler, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Wheeler placed first in the 
heavy middle weight Cross­
bred Division with the same 
steer that won reserve 
champion in the Bailey 
County Show this year. 
“Jodie’s steer was in the 
running for the grand 
championship, but did not 
place,” Tanksley said.

Chris Young, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Young, placed 
Con’t Page 6, Col. 8

Horticulture 
Short Course 
Set At 3-Way

A Home Horticulture 
Short Course for adults will 
be held on February 20, un­
der the sponsorship of the 
Three Way High School Vo­
cational Agriculture Depar­
tment, according to Don 
Parker, Superintendent, and 
Kermit R. Williams Teacher 
of Vocational Agriculture.

John Williamson, Horti­
culture Specialist with the 
Agricultural Adult Educa­
tion Program and the De-
Con't Page 6, Col. 5

Second Session Scheduled 
On Coal Slurry Pipeline

In a pre-hearing confer­
ence before a Railroad Com­
mission panel on January 25 
concerning a proposed 
Energy Transportation Sys­
tems, Inc. (ETSI) coal slurry 
pipeline, examiners made 
February 17 the deadline for 
briefs from all interested 
parties concerning the 
issues involved.

In two previous articles, 
the Journal has reported the 
pipeline was scheduled to be 
built to the Southwestern 
Public Service Company at 
Tolk Station, located north­
east of Muleshoe. The entire 
pipeline itself, would run 
from Wyoming to Houston, 
Texas. In late December a 
certificate of public conven­
ience to obtain right of way 
through eminent domain 
had been applied for by 
ESTI.

RRC examiners decided 
on the announced deadline

after a day long meeting in 
pre-hearing conference with 
proponents and opponents 
of the pipeline project. The 
session was scheduled to re­
ceive comment on proce­
dures the Commission will

follow in processing the 
application and determining 
the parties and issues in the
case.

The proposed 1800 mile 
underground pipeline is said
Con’t Page 6, Col. 5

Mule ties Lose By One 
To Friona In Overtime

Muleshoc’s Varsity Mul- 
ettes dropped a heartbreak- 
cr to Friona last Friday, 
February 3 by one point in 
an over-time shoot out. The 
final score was 32-31 in 
favor of Friona. This should 
leave the Mulettes 2-2 in 
district play, with Abernathy 
and Tulia left to play.

Brenda Ellis and Kelley 
Hamblen shared the honors 
in the scoring attack for the 
Mulettes Friday, with seven 
points each. Lenore Daniel,

a newcomer to the team, 
scored six points. Barbie 
Seaton had four, Kristi 
Campbell, 3; Meischelle 
Logsdon, 2 and Mary Nor­
man, 2.

Hamblen also led the pack 
in rebounding, totaling 13. 
Campbell and Norman tied 
with six rebounds each, 
while Logsdon had five. 
Ellis had three, Polly Harri­
son two, Seaton had three 
and K.K. Flowers and 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 2

the banquet. Guest speaker 
for the banquet this year is 
Harry Birdwell of Oklahoma 
City. Birdwell is currently 
General Manager of the 
Oklahoma Association of 
Electric Cooperatives and 
was formerly general man­
ager of the Oklahoma City 
Chamber of Commerce.

Birdwell received a Bach­
elor’s degree from Okla­
homa State University 
where he was student body 
president in 1972; and his 
law degree is from the Uni- 
veristy of Oklahoma. He is a 
former National President of 
the Future Farmers of 
America and was listed as 
one of the outstanding 
young men of American in 
1976 and again in 1981.

Gulley also spoke of the 
Chamber’s newest project of 
the "Board Game.” Which 
is something similar to 
Monopoly. An explanation 
of the project is included in 
the Thursday issue this 
week of the Journal.

Gulley also reminded 
members of the proposed 
Retail Merchants Meeting, 
which will be scheduled for 
all Merchants whether 
Chamber Members or not. 
The first one will be held 
this Friday, February 10 at 
12 noon at the Corral Rest­
aurant.

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock Friday, February 3, 
sent checks totaling $105.4 
million in local sales tax 
payments to the 980 cities 
that levy the one percent 
city sales tax.

Statewide, 1984 payments 
are running 2.57 percent 
ahead of last year. However, 
because of changes in re­
porting requirements that 
converted 15,000 small-and 
medium-sized taxpayers 
from quarterly to monthly 
payment schedules, it is 
difficult to compare raw pay­
ment figures for 1984 with 
the same period last year, 
since what were quarterly 
payments last year are now 
spread over three months.

February’s checks reflect 
sales made during the final, 
Christmas quarter of 1983 
and reported to the Comp­
troller’s Office by January 
20.

“ Even with the bookkeep­
ing changes, these pay­
ments reflect the recovery 
that is underway in our state 
economy,” Bullock said. 
“ When it’s all said and 
done, Texans apparently 
had the best Christmas in 
our history in terms of retail 
sales.”

Although the 1984 pay­
ments to date for Muleshoe 
and Bailey County reflect a 
minus 15.98 percent change 
from the 1983 payments at

Want To Take Over 
Muleshoe: Now You Can

“ If you have ever wanted 
to “ Take Over" the City of 
Muleshoe, you will soon 
have a chance to do just 
that," says John Gulley, 
Muleshoe Chamber of 
Commerce Manager. The 
Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture is 
sponsoring a new board 
game which will be called 
“ The Game of Muleshoe.” 
In this game, instead of 
buying Boardwalk or Park 
Place, players will be buying 
30 local businesses located 
around the board, Gulley* 
explained.

Board spaces are current­
ly being sold to Muleshoe 
businesses on a first-come, 
first served basis. The num­
ber of spaces are limited, so 
anyone interested should 
contact the Chamber as soon 
as possible. In addition to 
the spaces, other interested 
individuals may want to pur­
chase a copy of the game in 
advance, along with having 
their name printed on the 
game board. The cost for 
one game with your name 
listed on all copies of the 
game is $15.

In addition to being a 
fund-raising project for the 
Chamber, the board game

will also be a unique gift, an 
unusual souvenir for tourists 
and an opportunity for busi­
nesses to advertise on a 
product that people will 
spend hours looking at and 
playing.

the same time, again, the 
comparison is difficult since 
Muleshoe falls in the cate­
gory of the small and med­
ium sized taxpayers. This 
changes the picture some­
what.

Up until this report, 
Muleshoe and Bailey County 
have maintained a good per­
centage of change, while 
other comparable small cit­
ies and counties around re­
flected minus figures 
through the last few months 
of 1983.

In Bailey County and 
Muleshoe proper, net pay­
ment for the period ending 
January 27, 1984 amounted 
to $25,637.02, down from 
the $35,280.42 comparable 
payment in 1983. Total 1984 
payments to date for Mule­
shoe are $35,764.10, as com­
pared to $42,567.18 in 1983 
at the same time, which re­
flects the minus 15.98 per­
cent change to date.

In Castro County, which 
includes the cities of Dim- 
mitt. Hart and Nazareth, a 
minus 14.03 percent change 
to date was noted for this 
period. Net payment for the 
period just ended for Castro 
County was $21,364.36, as 
compared to $26,605.21 for 
1983. Total 1984 payments 
to date for that county were 
$30,257.76. down from the 
$35,195.38 for 1983. The city 
of Dim mitt reflected a minus 
10.95 percent change to 
date, while Hart showed a 
minus 64.82 percent. Naza­
reth’s percentage was 4,17 
percent for the period to 
date.

Muleshoe’s neighboring 
southern city of Morton, in 
Cochran County, reported a 
net payment this period of 
$6,561.25, down from the 
$8,255.65 in 1983. Payments
Con’t Page 6, Col. 3

Local TEC Office 
Asks Citizens Help

The Texas Employment 
Commission has requested 
local citizens’ support to 
help the Muleshoe, Texas 
Employment Commission 
office to remain open. “ It is 
requested that the public 
write a letter to the District 
Director. Mail your letter to: 
William E. Day, District Dir­
ector, Texas Employment 
Commission, Box 1682, 
Amarillo, Texas 79189,” 
says Lonnie Merriott, local 
TEC representative.

According to Merriott, the 
Governors office is propos­
ing to take away the funds 
from the small Texas Em­
ployment Commission 
offices statewide, and use 
them in the larger cities. 
Muleshoe TEC would be one 
of the offices that would be

closed. There are two types 
of funds available - 7-A and 
7-B. Muleshoe falls into the 
-B category. Governor 

Mark Whites’ Planning 
Committee plans to clô fc 
the 7-B offices, Merriott 
said.

Proposals are being re­
ceived from each State 
Agency, small offices or 
sub-offices requesting that 
these offices remain open.

Proposals from each Dis­
trict Director will be consid­
ered by the Governors Com­
mittee. Letters written to 
Mr. Day will be attached to 
his proposal and will be 
mailed to Governor Whites 
Committee for their consid­
eration.

Merriott stated: “ A TEC 
Con’t Page 6, Col. 7

FfVE AREA DfRECTORS:...\n the Five Area Telephone Cooperative, Inc. annual meeting on 
aturday, February 4, three directors were elected to serve another term. Incumbents 

re-elected were: (from left) Richard Black. Rex Griffiths, and Bob Foley, lhc  trio repret nn 
Districts 6, 7 and 5 respectively.
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Mrs. Johnny Puckett, nee 
Melissa Wilbanks, was 
honored with a wedding 
shower from 2 until 4 p.m.

Out To Lunch 
Bunch

The weekly luncheon for 
the Out to Lunch Bunch was 
held in the home of Mrs. 
Donna Noriega. A brief 
business meeting was held 
and Pam Achlin reported 
that she would like to start 
delivering the welcome pac­
kets again, now that the 
weather is warmer.

The group also voted to 
hold the next two luncheons 
in February, 10th and 17th 
in the meeting room of Sum­
mit Savings and Loan. It 
was also announced that 
there will be no luncheon on 
Feb. 24 due to no school.

Business for the March 
3rd luncheon will be to dis­
cuss election of officers.

Those attending the 
luncheon included: Mrs.
Pam Achlin, Mrs. Kathy 
Railsback, Mrs. Pat Mud- 
ford, Mrs. Evelyn Johnson, 
Mrs. Johnnie Ferris, Mrs. 
Donna Noriega and Mrs. 
Kathy Ward.

Sunday, Feb. 5 in the home 
of Mrs. Keith Vourazaris.

Guests were greeted by 
Mrs. Paul Wilbanks, mother 
of the bride; Mrs. John H. 
Puckett, mother of the 
groom; and the honoree, 
and registered by Marlea 
Cox.

The hostesses served 
punch, coffee and cookies 
from brass appointments. 
The serving table was ac­
cented with a crochet runner 
and a multi colored floral 
arrangement. The honoree’s 
corsage consisted of red 
roses.

Special guests included 
Mrs. Audrey Dudley and 
Mrs. Myrtle Puckett, grand­
mothers of the groom; Mrs. 
Earl Schmitz, Mrs. Viril 
Wilbanks and Mrs. Dana 
Arnold, grandmothers of the 
bride.

The hostesses gift was a 
microwave oven. Hostesses 
for the occasion included: 
Sandi Chitwood, Jan Craw­
ford, Pamela Miller, Donna 
Green, Jeanine Gunstream, 
Sandy Turner, Sylvia Vour­
azaris, Elinor Yerby, Sinda 
Floweers, Lynne Campbell, 
Lynne Box, Pat Angeley, 
Diana Harrison, Joan Lewis, 
Hattie Kinard, Sue Bessire, 
Marilyn Cox, Linda Marr 
and Donna Black.

Two Local Piano

Pafills hirst

Place Winners

MRS. JOHNNY \MEL1SSA] PUCKETT

Creative Woman
H r Sin *rv / llor<lrn

TWISTER BEADS

'4 00 per strand 

Other Jewelry Available 
272-4365 or 272-4808

Find Big Buy's 
In The

Classified Section 
< alt 272 4536

A TTENTION: 
FARMERS  - RANCHERS

H & R Block Tax Preparers are If you have questions on in- 
specially trained to help Farmers vestment credit, oil and gas 
and Ranchers with the new tax leases, unearned income, crops 
laws and regulations. The Block or livestock, or other form related 
personal interview assures quality tax items, see or call H & R Block 
and accuracy backed by the today. For one low fee, H & R 
Worldwide Block name Block offers accurate tax prepara-

oi L . . . tion assistance year round, withBlock stresses early filing for . . .  . . . _c , n l. ... or without an appointment. H & RFarmers and Ranchers with , .... . i . B lock o ffices a re  locateddepreciable items listed Block . . . .. , , throughout Texas,also prepares returns for farm -
employees No tax return is too , VM° vr ,elePhpne directory , . n , ,, for the office nearest you or callarge or too small and you will
receive every deduction to which 272-3332
you are entitled.

224 W. 2nd

Topics to be presented on 
February 14 and 18 include 
pita bread and making a 
petal collar. Pita Bread is 
not something new -  in fact, 
it’s a very old form of bread- 
making. Sometimes it’s call­
ed “ pocket bread” , because 
that’s how you serve it. 
When you slice it, you find a 
hidden pocket inside each 
half and the pocket can be 
filled with many different 
kinds of fillings. Bobbye 
Woodul, a homemaker from 
Portales had been experi­
menting with a variety of 
pita recipes for over ten 
years, and she will share 
some of her favorites with 
viewers on “ The Creative 
Woman” show.

The show will open with 
an interesting sewing tech­
nique on making collars 
without facings. Guest, 
Betty Chalker, a sewing in­
structor from Atlanta, Geor­
gia calls this technique a 
“ petal collar” . The seam is 
completely enclosed and the 
result is very attractive. 
Betty has other suggestions 
for ways this technique can

rF
Goes Easily On Your Walls! 
Goes Easy On Your W allet!

rn

Trutest

LATEX FIAT
w a l l  f in is h

Reg. J795 

Sale
$ 4 9 5

Popular Colors 
For Living Rooms, 

Dining Rooms, 
Bedrooms & Halls.

•Vanity Yellow •Satinwood 

Latex Flat Wall Finish • White •Ceiling white

Don’t put off painting rooms because of money - -  when you can 

get a paint this good at an economical price! This long-lasting interior 

finish spreads on smoothly, dries quickly and produces a rich finish.

Tools and hands clean up in soapy water.

Fry & Cox, Inc
0 W l S. First ijL

be used on other places on 
clothing.

On February 16 and 19, 
"The Creative Woman” 
show will feature tips for 
weight control through be­
havior modification with 
counselor, Carolyn Ruiz with 
Mental Health Resources, 
Inc. in Clovis and Portales. 
A topic called "Wonderful 
Ways with Cheese” will be 
presented by Mary Ellen 
Payne, Extension Home 
Economist in Carrizozo. 
Mrs. Payne will discuss the 
different categories or types 
of cheeses and will prepare 
two interesting cheese 
dishes.

Another topic on the show 
will be a demonstration on 
candlewicking, an old 
needlework technique that is 
becoming popular again. 
Thelma Craig, a homemaker 
from Albuquerque, has 
been candlewicking, as well 

many other forms ofas
needlework for many years, 
and she will show some of 
her items, and talk about 
candlewicking and the 
stitiches involved.

“ The Creative Woman” 
is produced and hosted by 
Sheryl Borden. The show 
airs on KENW-TV, Channel 
3 in Portales on Tuesday 
and Thursday at 12 noon, at 
2:00 p.m. on Saturday and 
also at 7:00 p.m. on Sunday. 
The show is also carried by
KRWG-TV in Las Cruces 
and by KNMh-TV in Albu­
querque.

Viewers can request cop­
ies of printed materials 
offered on the show by call­
ing on KENW TV’s toll-free 
telephone lines. In New 
Mexico, the number is: 
l-800-432-23ol, out of state: 
1-800-545-2359 and Portales 
and Roosevelt County: 
562-2112.

TOPS Club chapter Tx. 
No. 34 met at 6:30 p.m. 
Thursday, Feb. 2 in the 
meeting room of Bailey 
County Electric with 14 
members present.

Clara Crain, co-leader, 
called the meeting to order. 
The TOPS pledge was recit­
ed and the fellowship song 
sung. Minutes of the pre­
vious meeting were read by 
Rose Sain, secretary. They 
were approved as read.

Ernestine Steinbock was 
named loser for the week. 
First runner up was Irene 
Steinbock and Auror Mata 
was second runner up.

Monthly best loser was 
Ruth Clements with Zeffa 
Shafer as first runner up 
and Skeet Bradshaw second 
runner up. Clara Crain was 
named KOPS Queen for the 
month. The group was dis­
missed with the singing of 
the goodnight song.

Muleshoe Journal
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Twelve Piano Pupils of 
Elaine Damron participated 
in the “ Sonatina Sonata 
Concerto Contest” sponsor­
ed by the Lubbock Music 
Teacher's Association Febr­
uary 3-5 on the campus of 
Texas Tech University. 
Contestants played from a 
specified repertoire list and 
were judged against the 
pupils playing their same 
selection.

There were two first-place 
winners in the group who 
got to perform Sunday 
afternoon, February 5th, in 
the winner’s recitals held in 
Hemle Recital Hall on the 
Tech Campus. They were 
Lisa Hamilton, ninth grade 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Hamilton and Ali 
Cage, eighth-grade daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Cage. Lisa played the third 
movement of "Sonatina in 
Classic Style” by Gillock, 
and Ali played the second 
movement of “ Sonatina 
Opus 41, No. 2” by Wanhal.

A second-place winner in 
the contest was Alan
Finney, eleventh-grade son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Bob Fin­
ney. Third place winners in­
cluded the following: 
Lashelle Scoggin, four­
th-grade daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Kearney Scoggin; 
Heather Hutton, sixth-grade 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Terry Hutton; Kelly Conk­
lin, sixth-grade daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Norris Conk­
lin; Selina Gonzales, seven­
th-grade daughter of Mrs. 
Ana Gonzales; and Debbie 
Isaac, ninth-grade daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Isaac.

Other pupils of Mrs. 
Damron's entering the con­
test were Corley Hutton, 
Amy Turner, Dayna Hamil­
ton and Stacy McElroy. Jer­
emy Bruns was prepared to 
go but could not because of 
illness.

XT

Epsilon Delta
Valentine Tea
Held Saturday

ALI CAGE

A Valentine Tea was the 
setting for the regular meet­
ing of the Epsilon Delta 
chapter of Delta Kappa 
Gamma which was held on 
Saturday, Feb. 4 at 2:30 
p.m. at the Bailey County 
Civic Center meeting room.

Professional women edu­
cators from Muleshoe, 
Olton, Springlake-Earth, 
Sudan and Littlefield make 
up the membership of this 
society which has as one of 
its purposes—to advance 
the professional interest and 
position of women in educa­
tion.

Carrie Lee Bishop served

as chairman of the hostess 
committee which was made 
up of ten Muleshoe mem- 
bers.

Following a business 
meeting and discussion of 
committee reports, Laura 
Maxey and Lilliam Rape 
from Olton presented a pro­
gram on “The Other Half” 
in which they explored diff­
erent theories of the left 
versus the right brain func­
tions in regard to lealrning. 
Educators were urged to 
make themselves aware of 
the need to reach the total 
brain power of each student.

The 45 members present 
were served refreshments of 
cherry tarts topped with
whipped cream, mixed nuts, 
olives and pickles and coffee 
or tea, served from a table 
decorated with red and
white hearts and flowers.

re
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USA HAMILTON

Muleshoe Hobby Club 
met Thursday, Feb. 2 in the 
community room of Mule­
shoe State Bank with May 
Lloyd as hostess.

Fourteen members and a 
new member, Polly Clark, 
were present. Those attend­
ing included: Verna De­
ment. Blanche Awbrey, Mae 
Provence, Nan Gatlin, Ethel 
Julian, Bernice Amerson, 
Frances Bruns, Sammie 
Ethridge, Jo Wilson, Allie 
Barber, Ola Epperley, Jane 
Williams, Vickie Hendricks, 
Myrtle Chambless and Polly 
Clark.

Mabel Caldwell, pre­
sident, called the meeting to 
order. Minutes of the pre­
vious meeting were read 
and approved.

- j

During the American Revo­
lution, many brides did not 
wear white wedding gowns; 
they wore red as a symbol 
of rebellion.

Several articles were on 
display. Ola Epperley drew 
the hostess gift.

The next meeting will be 
on Thursday, Feb. If, with 
Sammie Ethridge as host­
ess.

S .L

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

PRICES EFFECTIVE FEBRUARY 9*11,1984

■  GIFT BO X ED  -  *

■VALENTINE
# )
M C A N D Y *  ’

UP TO

EACH * *

O

ALLSUP S CONVENIENT

MONEY
ORDERS

o

O  BORDENS
4 ORANGE 

JUICE

EACH
UP TO 
•2M"

LEMONS

1 0 *  each
NORTHERN

TISSUE
4 Rod

pkg
0

FRESH COOKED

CHICKEN/CHEESE

SANDWICHES

FRESH COOKED

MILD

LINKS

■ H 2 /9 9 *
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST * SELF SERV GAS ’  OPEN 24 HOURS FOR YOUR C O N V E N IE N C E #
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Journal Files

50 Years Ago
1934

Two carloads of flour were 
^  received this week to be 
w  distributed in the counties of 

Lamb, Parmer, Castro and 
Bailey.

Grocery specials advertis­
ed in the Journal this week 
included: 3 pounds coffee 91 
cents; 1 gal. honey 95 cents; 
quart jar mustard 19 cents; 
potatoes 10 pounds 21 cents; 

£  lettuce 5" cents head; apples 
20 cents dozen; oranges 17 
cents dozen; raisins 4 
pounds 33 cents; 1 gal. apri­
cots 49 cents; 1 gal. catsup 
59 cents; sliced bacon 21

West Plains
# I Medical Center

PLAINS MEDICAL 
CENTER

Feb. 3-Virgie H arding, 
Abel Peralez, L.G. Allen, 
Eihel H arding, Velma 
Howell, Ella Hallford, Sallie 
Schuster, John E. Burch,

(Ik Joanne Davenport, Johnny 
Bevers, David Shelby, Jim ­
enez M adrid, Lori Ellis, 
M arie Sowders, Ada Mur- 
rah, Justin  Daniel, Emma 
Kane, Vickie May -- Baby 
Girl M ay, Dell Snell -- Baby 
Boy Snell, M aria Estrada -- 

•Baby Boy E strada, Lisa D ar­
lene H cnnigh -  Baby Boy 
H ennigh.

•  Feb. 4-Virgie Harding,
Alpha Laney, Ethel Hard­
ing, Velma Howell, Ella 
Halford, Sallie Schuster, 
John Burch, JoAnne Daven­
port, Johnny Bevers, Debra 
Redwine, Lori Ellis, Marie 
Sowder, Ada Murrah, Dar­
lene Hennigh & Baby Boy, 
Dell Snell and Baby Boy and 
Emma Kane.

♦  Feb. 5-Virgie Harding,
Allie Browning, Alpha 
Laney, Ethel Harding, Vel­
ma Howell, Ella Halford, 
Sallie Schuster, John Burch, 
JoAnne Davenport, Clinton 
Busby, Loretta Lloyd, Marie 
Sowder, Ada Murrah, Dar­
lene Hennigh and Baby Boy, 
Dell Snell and Baby Boy and 
Emma Kane.

•  Feb.6-Virgie Harding. 
Allie Browning, Alpha Lan­
ey, Ethel Harding, Velma 
Howell, Ella Hallford, Sallie 
Schuster, John E. Burch, 
Joanne Davenport, Clinton 
Busby, Loretta Lloyd, Marie 
Sowders, Lisa Hennigh -- 
Baby Boy Hennigh, Dell 
Snell -  Baby Boy Snell and 
Emma Kane.

cents pound and round steak 
12Vi cents pound.

30 Years Ago
1954

Bailey County farmers 
have completed harvest of 
the biggest cotton crop ever 
grown in the county. Fig­
ures just released by the 
Census Bureau reveals that 
gin plants of the county 
have turned out 73,369 bales 
from the crop of 1953.

This compares to ginnings 
of 46,006 bales for the 1952 
crop.

Lubbock again was the 
state leader in ginnings, 
with 249,304 bales and Hale 
County was second in the 
area and in the state with 
227,068 bales. Nineteen 
counties of this section gin­
ned 1,403,209 bales, one 
fourth of Texas’ total.

20 Years Ago
1964

A local grocery store ad­
vertised the following spec­
ials in the Journal this week: 
fryers 27 cents pound; sir­
loin steak 89 cents pound; 
hams-shank portion 39 cents 
pound, butt portion 45 cents 
pound; T-bone steak 89 
cents pound; ground beef 3 
pounds $1; New York steak 
$1.69 pound; chuck roast 49 
cents pound; swiss steak 69 
cents pound; round steak 89 
cents pound; Armour Star, 
aged, heavy beef, cut, wrap­
ped and quick frozen beef 
sides, cut to your specifi­
cations 47 cents pound; 
shortening 3 pound can 59 
cents; 1 pound box crackers 
19 cents; cake mix 3 for $1; 
46 ounce can pineapple juice 
29 cents; 5 pound bag four 
49 cents; quart jar Mayonn­
aise 49 cents; grade A med­
ium eggs 45 cents dozen; 
and 5 pounds sugar 65 
cents.

10 Years Ago
1974

Doyce Turner of Mule­
shoe, of the Texas Farm 
Bureau Cotton Advisory 
Committee, attended a 
statewide meeting of the 
Texas Farm Bureau Cotton 
Division Jan. 30-Feb. 1. at 
the TFB headquarters in 
Waco. .....

Jimmy Gleason, son of 
Dr. and Mrs. Jerry Gleason, 
was presented the Steer 
Showmanship Award at the 
annual Bailey County Junior 
Livestock Show, held last 
weekend. Jimmy also re­
ceived the Jimmy Dale
Black Memorial Showman­
ship Award.

Agift
of beauty 

from 
Merle Norman

T h e B e a u ty  B o n u s . Y o u rs free  
w ith  a n y  $ 8 .5 0  p u rc h a s e  o f  
M e rle  N o rm a n  c o sm e tics .

The Merle Norman Beauty Bonus. A collection of 
four essential Merle Norman cosmetics in a 
sampler size. Moisture Emulsion, Liquid 
Makeup, Creamy Flo-Matic Mascara and a regular 
size Lipstick. All yours as our gift especially for 
spring. But please nurry. An offer this good can’t 
last long. This oifer is good through March 15, 
while supplies last. One to a customer.

nme noramn
The Place for the (.iistmu Face

Lnlrell
m 1510 W, American Rial.
h i mm mm tmm mm mm  ■ ■ w ith  this mi ipom
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MISS BECKY LOTT

Shannon Trent Kedwine
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Red- 

wine are the proud parents 
of a son born at 1:53 p.m. 
Feb. 3 in West Plains Medi­
cal Center.

The young man weighed 
six pounds two ounces and 
has been named Shannon 
Trent. He has two older 
brothers, Jarah, seven; and 
Brice, three years of age.

Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. A.E. Redwine of Mule­
shoe and Mr. and Mrs. R.J. 
Garner of Farwell.

Great grandmother is 
Minnie Redwine of Mule­
shoe.

Ashley I\icole Way
Mr. and Mrs. Danny May 

are the proud parents of a 
daughter, Ashley Nicole, 
born at 11:22 p.m. Feb. 1 in 
West Plains Medical Center.

Ashley Nicole weighed 
five pounds and 12 ounces. 
She has a brother, Jon­

athan, two years of age.
Grandparents are Don 

and Millie May of Muleshoe 
and Jackie Denham of 
Earth.

Lonnie Wade Snell
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Snell 

are the proud parents of a 
son born at 10:09 a.m. Feb. 
2 in West Plains Medical 
Center.

The young man weighed 
eight pounds 15 ounces and 
has been named Lonnie 
Wade. The couple have four 
other children: Paula 18, 
Curtis, 16, Rena, 14, and 
Jason, eight years of age.

Grandparents are Mary 
Austin and Ely Snell, both 
of Weatherford.

Adrian Estrada
Mr. and Mrs. Antero 

Estrada ofTexico, N.M. are 
the proud parents of a son 
born at 9:25 a.m. Feb. 2 in 
West Plains Medical Center.

The young man weighed 
six pounds seven ounces 
and has been named Adrian

He is the first child for 
the couple.

Grandparents are Antero 
and Adela Estrada of Tex- 
ico, N.M. and Edwardo and 
Delfina Mendez of Mexico.

uUiss Stott
Miss Becky Lott, bride 

elect of Wesley Cook, was 
feted with a bridal shower 
Saturday, Feb. 4 from 2 
until 3:30 p.m. in the home 
of Mrs. Ronnie Shafer.

Mrs. Vernon Lott, Mrs. 
Marshall Cook, Mrs. Ronnie 
Shafer and the honoree 
greeted the guests.

IRS Special
Dependency
Rales

Separated and divorced 
parents should look closely 
at the special requirements 
for claiming children as de­
pendents on federal tax re­
turns, the Internal Revenue 
Service says.

Dependent children of di­
vorced or seperated parents 
may be claimed as depen­
dents on the federal tax
return of:

1. the parent having cus­
tody of the child the greater 
part of the year, or

2. the parent without cus­
tody contributing most of 
the child’s support, or

3. the parent difined by 
the divorce or custody de­
cree as the one entitled to 
the dependency deduction.

For more detailed inform­
ation, telephone the IRS for 
Publication 504, “ Tax Infor­
mation for Divorced and 
Separated Individuals,’’ and 
Publication 501, “ Exemp­
tions.”

Miss Connie Lott, sister of 
the bride elect, served red 
punch, finger cookies, nuts 
and mints. The serving table 
was covered with a white 
lace cloth over red and ac­
cented with a red and white 
floral arrangement of tulips 
and daisies. The honoree’s 
corsage consisted of red and 
white carnations.

Special guests included: 
Mrs. Vernon Lott, mother of 
the bride elect; Mrs. Mar­
shall Cook, mother of the 
prospective groom; and 
Mrs. Alice Kelton, grand­
mother of the bride.

The hostesses gift was a 
vacuum cleaner. Hostesses 
for the occasion included: 
Frankie Lunsford, Betty 
Bryant, Faye Precure, 
Chubby Douglas, Neely 
Moore, Pat Shafer, Janie 
Hughes, Norma Jo Prather, 
Ella Dunbar, Virginia Bow­
ers, Betty Jo Davis, Gladys 
Wilson, Sue Reese, Mrs. 
Keith Parrish and Beulah 
Mimms.
lOCOOOOCOOCOOOGOOCO
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I CROCHET CLASS
I  LEARN TO CROCHET 

| WITH FABRIC. MAKE 

RAG VEST. CLASS 

BEGINS SOON. CALL: 

272-4365

L or 272-4808
O O C C O O S O C C O S O O O OJ

Computer Programming
In

BEGINNING BASIC
Offered By

Becky Taylor At
S fa if i t f t j  ^ B u s in e s s

P / r o ^ s i o n o f  S e w in e s

Next Class About To Start 
Only 5 To A Class 

. IO-IV 2 Hour - Lessons-$50 
213 E. Ave. B Office 272-5117
Muleshoe, Tx. Home 272-4602

TREES! TREES! I .

Thousands To Choose From
Now Is The Time To Plant These Beautiful Bareroot Trees At Almost V> The Cost 

[Of Container Stock, Plus Gain Almost A Full Year Growth By Planting N ow .^  3
........... _  ■ '1 , . a  m

Demonstration
Sat., Feb. 11 10 a.m.

How To Prune, Plont 8 Core For Bareroot Tree*

^  Coflee & Donuts 
Drawing For Tree
From Those Present

Apples
Red Delicious 
Yellow Delicious

* Jonathon Spv
* Winesap
* Granny Smith 

Gravenstein 
Rome Beauty

Apricot
Moorpark
Tilton

Plum
* Blue Damson
* Green Gage
* Burbank 

Mariposa

Cherry
Montmorency
Bing
Black Tartarian

Pear

Peach
Elberta 
Indian Blood 
Late Elberta 
Halberta Giant 
Cling
Indian Free 
Sam Houston

Shrubs
* Wisteria 

Althea 
Lilac
French Pussy Willow

* Vanhouttei Spirea
* Forsythia

Berries

Bartlett 
Keiffer 

Moon Glow  
Sure Crop

Thompson Seedless Grape 
Ruby Seedless 
Perlette 
Concord Grape

Bulbs
Tulips
Daffodils
Hyacinths

* Containerized

Shade Trees
American Hackberry 
American Sycamore 
Greenspire (Little Leaf) Linden 
Mimosa
Cottonless Cottonwood 
Russian Olive 
Green Ash
Thornless Honey Locust 
Fruitless Mulberry 
Globe Willow

* Weeping Willow 
Hybird Poplar 
Crimson King Maple

* Silver Maple 
Golden Honey Locust

* Japanese Pagoda 
Catalpa

Ornamentals
* Hopo Flowering Crab
* Rodiant Flowing Crab
* Zumi

Purple Leaf Flowing Plum
* Flowering Cherry
* Clump Birch
* Standard Birch

Idaho Flowering locust
* Flowering Peach 

Purple Smoke Tree
* Weeping Mulberry 

Tree Wisteria

Nut Trees
Western Schley Pecan 
Ne Plus Almond 
Non-Pariel Almond 
Cooke's Giant Sweet Walnut

A ll A v a ila b le  A t

IL
The Plantsation

419 W. Commericial, Portal** 356-4832
Hours; Mon. Thru Sat. 9-5 Visa & Master Card Welcome
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DEC A Raises Funds 
For Spina Bifida

Wednesday, January 25th 
the DECA chapter of Mule­
shoe had an “ Anything 
Goes” assembly. Approxi­
mately 150 students were 
involved in the different 
events. These included a pie 
eating contest, egg dropp­
ing, balloon bursting, pie 
tossing, and the tricycle 
race.

There were 14 organiza­
tions that entered the “ Any­
thing Goes” competition 
and each team had ten 
members. The teams paid 
an entry fee of $25.00. The

A round The « 
HiHalls At M.H.S.]

The Student council spon­
sored an attendance compe­
tition for each high school 
grade at the Abernathy 
names Tuesday night. Feb­
ruary 7th. Students signed 
up as they entered the gym 
and the class with the larg­
est percentage of its en­
rollment at the game was 
declared the winner. Those 
who attended the game for 
the winning class were 
treated to a coke party on 
Wednesday at school. At 
deadline time, the winner of 
the class competition was 
not known, but will be re­
ported in next week's 
Mule’s Tale. *****

Personalized annuals will 
be on sale through Monday, 
February 13th ONLY. Ann­
uals personalized with the 
student's name are $19.00 
and must be paid for in full 
before they will be ordered. 
Because the list of names to 
be stamped on the annuals 
must be received at the 
plant by February 15th, 
Monday at 3:30 will be the 
cut-off. Students may pur­
chase a standard annual for 
$17.00 throughout the 
spring, however.

On Valentine’s Day the 
annual staff will hold a 
drawing from all those 
names of people who have 
purchased an’84 Muletrain 
and will award a refund to 
the lucky winner. All stu­
dents and faculty members 
are urged to purchase their 
annuals by Monday, Febru­
ary 13th in order to be elig­
ible for the drawing. Anot­
her refund will be awarded 
to the annual staff member 
who sells the most annuals 
by February 14th. Annuals 
are $19.00 for personalized 
and $17.00 for the standard 
annual.

On Thursday morning, 
February 9 beginning at 
8:00, the results of the 
DECA/Junior Class Com- 
pu-Mate Dating Service 
questionnaires will be sold 
in the hallway in front of the 
office. Tables will be set up 
for Froshmen, Sophomores, 
Juniors, and Seniors and the 

•cqst will be $1.00 each for 
the list of the ten names of 
those people in MHS that 
are most compatible for 
each student. After 8:25 
a*m. Thursday, results may 
be purchased in the DECA 
M ercantile in room 24 at 
Mgh school.

The Seniors began their 
research papers on January 
30th and will be handing in 
their final draft on March 
12th. They have been doing 
their research at MHS Libr­
ary with the help of Mrs. 
Dillman, but will travel to 
the ENMU Library on Feb­
ruary 20th to do further re­
search. This grade will be 
counted as their fifth six 
weeks grade in English IV.

“ Mrs. Wrinkle is also 
scheduling a trip for the 
seniors to see the play 
“Othello” on March 23rd at 
the Globe theatre in Odessa.

team receiving the most 
points won a $50.00 prize 
and the Senior class walked 
away with top honors. Sec­
ond place went to VICA and 
they received $25.00. FHA 
won third place and received 
$10.00 for their efforts.

Serving as master of cere­
monies was Brock Sanders, 
and special guest for the 
event was Rita Funk, presi­
dent of the Spina Bifida 
Association of Lubbock. She 
was accompanied by her son 
Chris who was born with 
Spina Bifida and serves as a 
representative for the organ­
ization.

Additional money was 
raised from the 50 cents ad­
mission charge which entitl­
ed each person to one 
chance for the forty-two diff­
erent door prizes, which 
were donated by the local 
merchants and business­
men. Chris Funk did the 
honor of drawing for each of 
the door prizes while the 
events were being set up.

DECA raised $575.00 for 
Spina Bifida through their 
“ Anything Goes” assembly. 
These funds will be used for 
research and equipment to 
benefit victims of this birth 
defect. This event was 
DECA’s annual Civic Con­
sciousness Project and was 
thoroughly enjoyed by 
everyone who attended and 
participated in the compet­
ition.

G/T Class Observes
Laser Demonstration

DECA FUNDRAISER SUCCESSFUL...Chris Funk, Spina Bifida representative from Lubbock, 
drew for the door prizes given at the DECA’s recent “ Anything Goes” assembly held at 
Muleshoe High School. Over $500 was raised by the school organization to support the 
research on this birth defect.

Civics Mock Trial Team Selected
MHS senior Civics stu­

dents of Mrs. Jean Allison 
have been in the elimination 
process to choose a Mock 
Trial Team which will com­
pete in the regional compe­
tition on February 23 in a 
Lubbock Courtroom. Every 
civics student was encour-

MHS Students Attend 
Career Festival

Six HERO and one DECA 
student attended the PASS 
Career Festival at the Lub­
bock Civic Center on Thurs­
day, February 2. The festi­
val, sponsored by various
Lubbock Civic Groups, fea­
tured guest speakers from 
all walks of life and booths 
sponsored by individual bus­
inesses. Booths were ar­
ranged by career clusters. 
Clusters represented were 
health, education, communi­
cations, service, entertain­
ment, sales, skilled trades, 
banking and finance, art and 
design, science and techno­
logy, and transportation. 
Over one hundred business­
es provided information 
about specific company

Extemporaneous
Speakers

Compete
Muleshoe High School's 

extemporaneous speaking 
squad competed in the 
Amarillo Tascosa Speech
Tournament on February 
3rd and 4th. Brenda Flowers 
won first place in the wo­
men’s division out of 
ninety-two competitors. 
Jimmie Lee competed in the 
men’s division with 
ninety-six competitors. Jim­
mie received a 4-2-1 in his 
three preliminary rounds, 
but did not advance on total 
speaker points. The M.H.S. 
Speech Squad will compete 
in the Lubbock Cooper tour­
nament on February 18th.

skills needed for employ­
ment, and job opportunities 
for the future.

Featured speaker for the 
day was Brigadier General 
Charles M. Duke, lunar 
module pilot for the Apollo 
16 moon mission in April 
1972. General Duke related 
many of his experiences as 
an astronaut and narrated a 
film of his lunar explora­
tions. He stressed the im­
portance of enjoying your 
work and urged young peo­
ple to apply themselves in 
whatever career they 
choose. “ You don’t have to 
be a pilot like I was. The 
program is now open to 
many different careers and 
it is also open to women,” 
he said. He also stated, 
"You do not have to be a 
genius—just a person who is 
willing to apply himslef and 
take every opportunity for 
further education. Ours is a 
technological society and we 
must always be learning.” 
General Duke’s insights 
were especially timely since 
his talk came the day before 
the Challenger space shuttle 
began its tenth mission. 
General Duke made his aud­
ience very aware of the 
magnitude of the entire 
space program and the dan­
ger to the individuals invol­
ved.

HERO members attend­
ing were Eddie Perez, David 
Reid, Greg McCarty, Deena 
Burris, Tonda Gunstream, 
and Cathy Lopez, with their 
sponsor Mrs. Linda Tanks- 
ley. Representing DECA 
were Rachel Hodges and 
sponsor Mrs. Lola Pylant.

aged to try out for one of the 
six positions on the Mock 
Trial Team and, in the past 
week, each of the three 
civics classes acted out the 
Mock Trial case which will 
be used in the state wide 
competition.

Students in the classes 
enacted a courtroom scene 
with each student portraying 
either one of the attorneys 
for the plaintiff or for the 
defendent, or witness for 
either the plaintiff or defen­
dent, the judge, bailiff, 
court clerk, or a jury mem­
ber. Jury members kept de­
tailed notes and used the 
competition score sheet in 
judging the performance of 
the team members. In

Computers 

Invade MISD 

Campuses
What is a computer doing 

in the teacher's lounge?
Muleshoe I.S.D. will be 

making a commitment for a 
computer literacy program 
(k-12) in the near future. As 
programs are developed, 
and equipment purchased, 
the school district will need 
input from the faculty as to 
what will work best in the 
“ field” .

For the next twelve weeks 
teachers will have an op­
portunity to have a unique 
experience. The administra­
tion will be placing different 
computers and complete 
programs in the teachers’ 
lounge on each school cam­
pus. The faculty is asked to 
get acquainted with the var­
ious types of computers 
(Apple He, TRS 80, Com­
modore 64, and Commodore 
Vic 20) and to also explore 
the various programs avail­
able with each.

The Apple He will be left 
on each campus. After the 
first three weeks, the prin­
cipal of each building will 
decide where he wants to 
assign this computer.

choosing the Mock Trial 
Team these notes and score- 
sheets were used, as well as 
a student vote for outstand­
ing participation. Members 
chosen to represent Mule­
shoe High School at the 
statewide competition are: 
Attorneys for the plaintiff. 
Kelly Sue Hamblen, and*,CI
Ronald Briggs. Attorneys 
for the defendent Brenda 
Flowers and Jimmie Lee. 
Witnesses for both the
plaintiff and the defendent, 
Aldo Almanzo and Michael 
Barrett. Alternates who 
could serve either as attor­
neys or witnesses, Kacy 
Henry and Joe Ward.

This will be the third year 
that Mrs. Allison has had 
some of her students enter­
ed in the statewide compe­
tition. Tne first year the 
Muleshoe team went to 
state and got into the quar­
ter finals. Last year Mule­
shoe won second at regional 
competition. Muleshoe must 
compete against all classes 
of schools and the winner 
will be chosen between 
Muleshoe and some of Lub­
bock’s best teams this year 
at the regional competition. 
The team will spend many 
hours perfecting their per­
formance with local attor­
neys acting as professional 
advisors.

The members of the MHS 
Gifted/Talented class travel­
ed to Lubbock on Wednes­
day, February 1st for a field 
trip. John Isaac, Tracy Tun- 
nell, Wade King, Brent 
Black, Randall Stevens, 
Betsy Lunsford, Kristi 
Campbell, Jimmie Lee, and 
Mis. Pat Black, sponsor 
spent the morning touring 
the Texas Tech Museum 
and Ranching Heritage 
Center. After a meal at Red 
Lobster, the group proceed­
ed to the Physics Depart­
ment at Texas Tech for a 
laser demonstration by Dr. 
Roland Menzel, the fore­
most authority in the field of 
forensic physics. Unfortun­
ately, Dr. Menzel had had to 
go home that morning due 
to a bad case of the flu, but 
he arranged for two gradu­
ate students, Jim Burt and 
Tim Sinor to make a pre­
sentation to the class.

Dr. Menzel has pioneered 
the use of the laser in for­
ensic physics, especially in 
the area of detecting finger­
prints. Recently he aided

the police in Denver, Colo­
rado who dismantled a car 
belonging to a suspected 
child molester and shipped 
it to Lubbock. Dr. Menzel 
was able to use the laser to 
detect a child’s fingerprints 
on the back door. He has 
done work of this type for 
police departments all a- 
cross the country and the 
graduate students told the 
class they are constantly re­
ceiving weapons such as 
guns and knives, and doors, 
funrniture, windows, even a 
hot water heater, to process 
for fingerprints. The laser, 
in combination with special 
fluorescent dusting mat­
erials, causes otherwise in­
visible prints to fluoresce 
brilliantly away from back­
grounds that might other­
wise distort the print. The 
department is also currently 
working on a project using 
the laser to detect cavities in 
cats!

Another ongoing project 
being undertaken by a grad­
uate student working on his 
masters degree in using the

Kerry Moore Ed. Theatre Convention
Kerry Moore, Theatre 

Arts teacher at Muleshoe 
High School, has just re­
turned from attending the 
Texas Educational Theatre
Association State Conven­
tion in Austin which was 
held on January 26-28.

The Texas Educational 
Theatre Association was 
founded in 1950 for “ the 
promotion and expansion of 
educational theatre in Tex­
as” .

During this year’s conven­
tion Mr. Moore had the 
opportunity of seeing eigh­
teen performances, choosing 
fromover 115 workshops on 
every aspect of theatre,

Happy
Birthday

February 10
Basketball games at Tulia, 
San Antonio live stock show 
(10th- 19th)

February 13 
Patriotic Week

February 14
J.V. and Varsity Boys bas­
ketball games against Dim- 
mitt here.

J [IL All-Region Band Concert Held
January 26-28, twenty 

members of the Mighty 
” M" Band traveled to Lub­
bock to participate in the 
All-Region Band. This uni­
que band is made up of 
members of different bands 
in the north zone region. 
Muleshoe had the most stu­
dents qualify for All-Region 
band. The group stayed at 
the South Park Inn along 
with several other high 
school bands. The members 
attended rehearsals Thurs- 
day-Saturday under the clin­
ician, Dr. Charlie Trailer 
from Dalhart. Highlights of 
the trip were eating at the 
Roadhouse and swimming at 
the motel. Saturday night.

the trip reached its climax 
when the band presented 
the concert. The All-Region 
band members from Mule­
shoe were Shelley Sain, 
Donna Horn, Nicki Hagins, 
Susie Leal, Shannon Croz- 
ier, Robert Orozco, Kathy 
Mudford, Melissa Wagnon, 
Brenda Flowers, Diana 
Martinez, Alan Finney,
Dorinda Shafer, Steven Eth­
ridge, Charlie Mata, Scott 
Williams, Joe Ambriz,
Sergio Leal, Chris Hernan­
dez, Joel Soto, and Joey 
Cox. They were accompan­
ied by their band directors 
Anthony Gibson and Martha 
Anthis.

V * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *

» Calendar i
j Of Events *
% **★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ **★ *★ ♦

February 9th 
Shelley Sain

February 11th
Cari Ryder

February 12th 
Chad Williams

participating in the 20th 
year celebration of the Sec­
ondary Theatre Association, 
meeting prominent author­
ities from the east and west 
coast, and hearing special 
convention guests Robert 
Foxworth of Falcon Crest 
and Rene Enriquez of Hill 
Street Blues.

Financial Aid
Workshop
Slated

South Plains College will 
hold a special Financial Aid 
Workshop for students and 
parents on February 15, 
1984. The meeting will be­
gin at 7:00 p.m. in the 
Student Assistance Center 
on the College’s Levelland 
campus. The Student Assis­
tance Center is located on 
the third floor of the College 
Library. Any student, re­
gardless of whether they 
plan to attend SPC in the 
fall or not, is welcome to 
attend this workshop.

The workshop will touch 
on the types of federal and 
state financial aid programs 
which are available to stu­
dents, how to apply for 
these programs, and who is 
eligible to receive financial 
aid. Tips on hunting down 
and applying for scholar­

ships will also be provided.
Should you have any 

questions contact Linda 
Marr at Muleshoe High 
School (272-3080) or Step­
hen John at South Plains 
College.

laser to detect minute con­
centrations of methane gas 
above underground oil de­
posits. Mr. Burt and Mr. 
Sinor also demonstrated 
how to use the laser to run a 
spectograph on a compound, 
and they impressed the 
class with their examples of 
the dangers of using a laser. 
The danger involves care­
lessness in handling the 
laser which has left people 
with holes through the palm 
of their hand or even 
through the retina of their 
eye! While one particularly 
powerful laser was being 
demonstrated, the group 
wore goggles to protect their 
eyes from the bright light.

The G/T class thoroughly 
enjoyed the demonstration 
and lecture presented by Dr. 
Menzel’s students and felt 
that they were much better 
prepared now to tackle the 
practice problem on lasers 
for the Texas Future Pro­
blem Solving competition. 
The top ten senior teams in 
Texas will be invited to the 
state bowl on the basis of 
the contest entries on Prac­
tice Problem 111 concerning 
future problems with lasers. 
This problem will be comp­
leted and mailed by March 
2nd.

HECE Class
Makes
Tortillas

Gary Watkins, a junior at 
MHS, demonstrated the 
technique of making flour 
tortillas to Mrs. Tanksley’s 
HECE class on Wednesday, 
January 25th during first 
period. Cathy Lopez, Suz- 
ette Rojas, Kristi Spies, 
Pam Tandy, and Tina Ruth- 
ardt tried their hand at mak­
ing the flour toritllas from 
scratch and came up with 
some very edible products, 
especially when served 
buttered and fresh out of the 
skillet. Gary used the follow­
ing recipe for his demon­
stration: 3 cups flour, 3 
teaspoons baking powder, 
1-2 teaspoons salt ( to taste),
3 tablespoons lard or 
grease. Mix flour, baking 
powder and salt until blend­
ed. Work in lard or grease, 
adding more if necessary. 
Add hot water a little at a 
time until bail of dough 
forms. Knead dough, then 
let sit covered for at least 15 
minutes. The longer it sits, 
the better. Pinch off balls of 
dough. Flour rolling pin and 
roll out into circles. Preheat 
ungreased skillet on med­
ium to midium high heat. 
Brown tortillas on both sides 
and put in towel folded 
around them to keep warm 
and moist. Yields approxi­
mately 15 tortillas.

February 14th
Becky Mardis and Craig
Hunt

February 15th
Sherri Stovall and Jeff

n

t

t

McCarty. GARY WATKINS



M a r t i n  G r a v e s i d e  S i-
Graveside services for 

Doyce F. Martin, 65, were 
held at 11:30 a.m. Wed­
nesday. Feb. 8 in the Mule- 
shoe Cemetery with the 
Rev. V.L. Huggins, pastor 
of the Trinity Baptist Church 
officiating.

Burial was under the dir­
ection of Ellis Funeral 
Home. Martin died at 3:40 
p.m. Saturday in Lubbock 
General Hospital at Lub-

Make your 
love blossom .

The Heart-to~Heart'“ 
Bouquet from 

your FTD® Florist.

Valentine’s Day 
is Tuesday, February 14.

Decorn font 
Nursery & Floral

2 7 2 -4 3 4 0  
Send your thoughts 

with special ©  care.'"

» trademark oTTlorc' i
Transwerid Defevery Assoarto-

t r i c e s  H e l d
bock.

A native of Dallas County, 
Martin was born May 16, 
1918, and moved to Mule- 
shoe in May of 1983, from 
Littlefield. He married 
Myrtle Belle Steele on April 
21. 1945, in Wilmington, 
Calif. Martin was a farmer 
and a Baptist.

Survivors include his wife, 
Myrtle Belle; four sisters, 
Mrs. Alberta Crocker and 
Mrs. Emily Pearson, both of 
Parker Dam, Calif., Mrs. 
Mildren Killen of Noel, 
Missouri, and Mrs. Marry 
Beth Meeks of Farwell; two 
brothers, Charles Martin of 
Littlefield and John Geo. 
Martin of Los Angeles, 
Calif.; and several nieces 
and nephews.

DOYCE F. MARTIN

1984 seed cost. “

ID U R IN G  P IO N E E R  D A Y SU
| A n d 9M .F R E E B u c h l.  

just for stopping by.

Gene Franks
925-6626

PLAINS 
PRIDE
Thousands of corn acres prove this 
pair from Pioneer is doing some­
thing right.
3186
Over the past three years in on-(arnt tests in this 
area, no hybrid has produced a higher average yield 
than this one However, it's the "extras that make 
3186 ideally suited for irrigated Plains production.
Drouth tolerance— making the most of weather and 
moisture conditions. Plus excellent stalk strength, out­
standing late season plant health, very good ear relen 
lion. Disease resistance A  tall semi upright-leafed hybrid. 
3186 normally produces large, girlhy ears with excellent shuck 
cover, for either grain or silage production.

3184
It provides protection against diseases and stress and consistently 

produces excellent yields. In fact.in over 300on-farm yield tests 
in this area during the past seven years. 3184’s average yield 

has been almost 700 Ibs/A more than competitive hybrids 
But. it's under lough growing conditions that 3184 really 

shines. Exceptional root and stalk strength Shorter 
growth habit, relatively low ear placement, late season 

plant health and excellent stay-green qualities It's 
often used as the measure for slandahilily in this 

area Preferred by food corn processors !>e< arise 
of excellent grain quality and shuck cover.

Plant 'em together. They’ll give great 
yields in the good years and make 

the most of the tough years, too. 
Come on in and let's talk.

Francis Franks, Jr.
925-6454
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Muleshoe 

School Menu

February 13-17, 1984 
MONDAY 

BREAKFAST
Milk, Cereal, Toast and 
Fruit

LUNCH
Pizza, Mixed Veg. Pickles 
and Fruit

TUESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Muffin and Juice 
LUNCH

Milk, Hamburgers, Lettuce 
& Tomatoes, Pickles & 
Onions, Tater Tots and Fruit 
Cobbler

TUESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Muffin, and Juice 
LUNCH

Milk, Hamburgers, Lettuce 
& Tomatoes, Pickles &

Onions, Tater Tots and Fruit 
Cobbler

WEDNESDAY 
BREAKFAST 

Milk, Honeybun and Fruit 
LUNCH

Milk, Enchilada Casserole, 
Buttered Corn, Beans, Corn- 
bread and Pudding 

THURSDAY 
BREAKFAST

Milk, Biscuits, Gravy, Sau­
sage and Juice

LUNCH
Milk, Hot Dogs, Tater Tots, 
Tossed Salad and Peanut- 
butter Confection 

FRIDAY 
BREAKFAST

Milk, Toast, Cereal and 
Fruit

LUNCH
Milk, Fried Chicken, Gravy, 
Green Beans, Creamed Po­
tatoes, Hot Rolls, and Fruit 

COMBO LINE 
Feb. 13-17, 1984 

MONDAY
Milk or Tea, Baked Ham, 
Green Beans, Creamed Pot­

atoes, Hot Rolls and Fruit 
TUESDAY

Hamburgers, Lettuce & To­
matoes, Pickles & Onions, 
Tater Tots and Fruit Cobbler 

WEDNESDAY 
Milk or Tea, Chalupas, 
Beans, Lettuce & Tomatoes, 
Cheese, Crackers and Fruit 

THURSDAY
Milk or Tea, Skillet Dinner, 
Whole Potatoes, Blackeyed 
Peas, Cornbread and Fruit 

FRIDAY
Milk or Tea, Bar-B-Q on 
Bun, Potato Salad, Pork & 
Beans and Fruit

(.lassijieil I its

(.all 2 7 2 - 1330

Construction Proceeding On Hu y. 214
Construction work is pro­

ceeding with grading, sal­
vaging and replacing caliche 
base on SH 214 from US 70 
in Muleshoe to the Parmer

, '<* *

County line, Rhea E. Brad­
ley, Supervising Resident 
of Highways and Public 
transportation, Littlefield, 
announced today. This 
phase of work is expected to 
be completed this month.

* *  * *

Note to hard work­
ers: It cost less to eat 
regularly now than to 
report to the doctor 
regularly later, when 
perhaps it is already too 
late.

The hauling of caliche ba­
se for the project will begin 
in the near future.

The public is urged to 
obey the laws and watch for 
warning signs, barricades
and speed limits through 
construction.

* * * *
Accidents on our 

highways occur every 
day, not just during holi­
day weekends.

Best
of

Press

A Dil/crrinv 
The trouble with 

many of us is that wc 
would rather be ruined 
bv praise than saved bv 
criticism.

Night is the half of life, 
and the better half.

!i ( f l )  ^
o iik m u m i >S>MIIAC

ROBERT D. GREEN, INC.
* * •  W. AMERICAN tLV D . — M ULESHOE, TEXA S 7*M7

—  HOME OF THE GREEN MACHINES —

Terry Yell••• # HOME PH.
sm 7M-Z772 ĵ|es Representatjve 272-4948

^/ttlu t/t J .  ^W einstein , 

m id

J t a  C m w on,

4

om m cc  flv ojtfniwj ef flir/A eftiff ol 

2000 ''U M  21st (Jhiri Oulfr M  
^\lru RRI0I

763-944C
Pw'fiVT Piinitfrt to wrrlirnP and ou/tfjiwf cliwm*: of tbr rijf

RAN0GEAR Now
Available

Randolph Gearhead

20 Hp. to

750 Hp.

Wt CAN SAVE YOU 

MONEY -  COME IN AND 

CHECK WIYH BUTCH OR 

R. 0. BEFORE YOU BUY

Leo’s Blacksmith &  Machine

310 W. Am erican Blvd. 272-4418

EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH
Iglesia bautista Emmancul
107 East Third
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor

16th & AVE. D CHURCH OF CHRIST

James Johnson, Minister 
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.

RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST CHURCH

17th and West Avc. D 
Brock Sanders, Pastor

SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION
East Third and Avc. E 
Roy Martinez, Pastor

TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH

'314 Avc. B
V.L. "Buster " Huggins

PROGRESS BAPTIS1. CHURCH

Donald G. Proctor, Pastor 
Progress, Texas

SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F 
Luis Campos, Pastor

UNITED PENTAC0STAL GOSPEL 

LIGHTHOUSE CHURCH

207 E. Ave G.
Rev. Don Green

MULESHOE BAPTIST CHURCH

8th and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd, Pastor

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH

220 West Avc. E

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD
,521 South First

NEW COVENANT CHURCH

Plainview Highway 
Sunday - 10:00 a.m. 
Wednesday - 7:00 p.m. 
Jininiy Low. Pastor

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE

9th and Avc. C 
Jimmie Williams, Pastor

m

T h e  C h u r c h  i t  G o d '*  ap p o in te d  
• genet in this w orld  for spreading the j 
knowledge of H u  Im t  for man and of 
H it demand for man to retpond 10 that
love bi loving hit neighbor W n h nu i 
ih it grounding m ihe l«ve of God. no 
government or to* ett or wav of lift- 
w ill long p-rtevere and the freedomt 
which w« hold to dear w ill m evioblx 
pem h Therefore. c*cn from a aelftth 
point of tiew . one should support ihe 
C h u n h  for ihe take of the welfare of 
himtelf and h it  f»m »lt Bt-tond ih.tr 
however, even person should uphold 
and partiopate in ihe C h u n h  heiauw 
n le llt  the truih about man's Me. death 
and dctiint , the truth w h uh  alone w ill 
tet him free to Its* at a ch ild  of G od

w live in a day of crowds . .. crowds at

football games, crowds in many school­

rooms, crowds on the highways every 

weekend and holiday, crowds rushing to 

and from work each day, crowds on the 

sidewalks shopping — crowds everywhere.

Sometimes, therefore, individual persons 

get the feeling that they are "lost in the 

crowd," that as individuals they don’t count 

for much and no one pays much attention 

to them. It’s possible to he very lonely in 

a crowd.

But there is one place in our community 

where individuals as individuals do count, 

where even- single one of us can be assured 

that we will be- recognized and welcomed 

and appreciated as a person

That place is at church, one of the friendly 

churches in our community. For this is the 

church's mission and purpose — to minister 

to and help individuals as they are and w here 

they are, good or bad, rich or poor, old or 

young, great or small, weak or strong.

There’s a church in your neighborhood 

which is w .tiling to help you as an individual 

anil to w elcome you as a person this Sunday. 

W hy not attend that church —  and lose that 

lost feeling?

LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH

Phone 946-3413
B.C. Stonecipher, Pastor

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH

130 W. Ave. G
Dick Tarr, Pastor
Sunday School - 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.

LATIN AMERICAN METHODIST MISSION

5th and Ave. D 
R.Q. Chavez, Pastor

THE COMMUNITY CHURCH

Morton Highway 
H.D. Hunter, Pastor

CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
Rev. Darrel Martin

1733 W. Ave. C

PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH

1st and 3rd Sunday.
Clifford Slay. Pastoi

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH

507 W. 2nd. Muleshoe 
Bill Kent. Pastor

ST. JOHN LUTHERAN

Lariat, Texas
Sunday School - 10:00 a.m.
Worship Service - ! 1:00 a.m.
Herman J. Schelter, Pastor

PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH

621 S. *-irst 
Elder Ben hnson

"Thr Sou of man is tome to seek and to 

save that which was Inst." ( la k e  19:10)

Muleshoe Co-op 
Gins

TEMPL0 CALVARI0

507 S. Main 
Sunday - 10:00 a.m.
Sunday evening - 7:00 p.m. 
Evangelistic Services 
J.L. Soto. Pastor

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION CATHOLIC
Father Patrick Maher
Northeast of City in Morrison Edition

ST. MATTHEW BAPTIST CHURCH
Corner of West Boston and W. Birch 
M.S. Brown, Pastor ___

MULESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST

Clovis Highway 
John A. Boor, Minister

JEH0VA WITNESS

Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery, Pastor

American Valley , 
Inc.

4 D a i  
Q u e e n Hawkins

Manager
Bratcher Motor 

Supply

K em p’s Dicount 
Furniture

Western Drug

Robert Green,
Your Inc. Oldsnwbile, 
(jMCyPontiac, Buick Dealer

Farmers Spraying 
Service

Irrigation Pumps 
& Power

Serv-AU Thriftway
We’re Proud To Give You 

More You

Muleshoe Body 
Shop

U- MULESHOE ] 
SUPERMARKET

HOWE OWNED V 
AND HOWE OPERAtfD

Main Street 
Beauty Salon
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Around Muleshoe Tax Rebate
Con't from

The II Penseroso Study 
Club of Lockney, Texas will 
sponsor an arts and crafts 
show on Saturday, April 28 
from 9 a.m. until 5 p.m. at 
the Lockney Elementary 
Cafeteria. Fees are $25 per 
8 x 10 booth and an extra $5 
for each additional exhibi­
tor. To register for a booth 
call 296-5006 or 652-2534. 

*****

Page 1 

last days

Con’t from Page 1

The office will 
close at 5 p.m. that day.

*****

The 1983 Farmer’s Tax 
Guides may be obtained
from the Bailey County Ex­
tension Office, according to 
County Agent Spencer
Tanksley. They explain how 
the Federal Tax Laws apply 
to farming, giving explan­
ations and examples.

The Jennyslippers will 
sponsor skating at the 
Bailey County Civic Center 
on Friday, February 10 at 7 
p.m. This will be the start of 
their fund-rising activities 
for the July fireworks pro­
ject. In addition to skating, a 
‘‘skate exchange table” will 
be set up so that those hav­
ing skates they have out­
grown may bring them for 
exchange, sale or trade for 
others.

*****
State Controller Bob 

Bullock has announced that 
Phillip Land from his 
Lubbock field office will be 
at the Bailey County Court­
house in the County Comis- 
sioner Courtroom on Tueday 
February 14, 1984 from 2:00 
p.m. to 4:00 p.m.. A comp­
troller’s representative ia 
available to assist local resi­
dents at the courthouse the 
second Tuesday of each 
month.

*****
Farmers are reminded 

that February 24 is the final 
date for signup in the 1^84 
Farm Program, and are ad­
vised to sign up early to 
avoid waiting lines on the

Mulattos...
Con’t from Page 1 
Daniel had one each. Kacy 
Henry also saw some action 
for the Mulettes.

Shots from the field for 
the Mulettes were low, as 
they hit only 11 out of 52 
attempted for 21 percent. 
On free throws, however, 
the Mulette squad did better 
hitting nine out of 18 for 50 
percent.

The Mulettes had a total 
of 15 steals, with Daniel 
having the most with six. 
Ellis had four; Norman, 
three; and Logsdon, two.

The last home game was 
played on February 7 in 
Muleshoe for the Mulettes 
against Abernathy, and 
their final game will be 
played on Friday, February 
10 at Tulia.

to date for 1984 in Morton 
totaled $8,414.58, down 
from the $9,254.08 of 1983 
at the same time. This re­
flects a minus 9.07 percent 
change to date. County 
wide, however, Whiteface 
reflected a 63.00 percent 
change to date to the good, 
which made the County’s 
overall change to date of 
minus 4.01 percent.

Deaf Smith County and 
Hereford had a net payment 
this period of $79,402.75, 
down from the $86,764.39 of
1983 at the same time. Total 
payments to date there in
1984 amount to $107,381.25, 
up from the $106,586.62 
payment of 1983 at the same 
time, reflecting an 0.75 per­
cent change to date.

The City of Littlefield in 
Lamb County had a net 
payment for the period end­
ing January 27 of 
$37,662.68, down from the 
$46,562.23 payment at the 
same time in 1983. Total 
payments to date for Little­
field are $53,457.29, down 
from the $55,762.98 pay­
ment at the same time in 
1983. This reflects a minus 
4.13 percent change to date 
for that city. Lamb County 
overall showed a minus 1.31 
percent change to date, and 
was saved by the community 
of Earth, which had a 76.84 
percent change to date re­
flected. Other cities in 
Lamb: Amherst, Olton and 
Sudan all reflected a minus 
percentage change to date 
in excess of 15.08 percent.

In Farwell, net payment 
for the period just past was 
$2,844.46, down from the 
$3,932.67 of last year. Total 
payments to date there for

1984 amount to $4,227.32, 
down from the $4,447.60 of 
1983, reflecting a minus 
4.95 percent change to date. 
In Friona, net payments this 
period totaled $11,416.40, 
down from the $15,953.82 of 
1983. Total payments for 
1984 to date in Friona are 
$17,451.98, down from the 
$19,298.14 of 1983, reflect­
ing a minus 9.57 percent 
change to date for that city. 
Bovina, another town in Par­
mer County reflected a min­
us 19.33 percent change to 
date, giving a total change 
for the county of minus 
10.61 percent to date.

Houston received the 
largest check-for $19.2 mil- 
lion--for a 1984 total of $27.4 
million, down 3 percent 
from last year. Dallas' check 
for $12.6 million brought 
year-to-date payments to 
$18 million, up 5 percent.

San Antonio’s payment 
was $6.6 million for a $9.1 
million 1984 total, up 14 
percent. Austin’s February 
check for $4.1 million 
brought its yearly total to 
$6.1 million, up 9 percent.

Fort Worth received $3.7 
million for total payments 
this year of $5.3 million, 
down 1 percent from 1983. 
El Paso’s check for $2.2 
million brought its year to 
date total to $3.3 million, up 
7 percent.

Bullock also sent checks 
to the Metropolitan Transit 
Authorities in Houston and 
San Antonio. Houston rece­
ived $22.3 million, ior a total 
$31.8 million this year. San 
Antonio received $3.6 mil­
lion, bringing 1984 total 
payments to $5.1 million

Five Area
Con’t from Page 1

in the Needmore, Muleshoe 
tc Littlefield exchanges. 
Kidd promised that the Co­
operative would get to the 
others as soon as possible, 
but explained that they were 
doing the worst problems 
first.

The mobile telephone 
system in the Lazbuddie 
area was replaced in 1983 
for the first time in 17 years. 
Kidd also stated that much 
had been accomplished in 
the way of testing equip­
ment, enabling repairmen to 
use remote tests to pinpoint 
problems in the systems.

Plans for 1984 included no 
big jobs for the Cooperative 
according to Kidd. ‘‘We 
plan on waiting on the final 
decisions on divestiture be­
fore any money is spent, 
and we plan to try to cut our 
expenses in half,” he said. 
Five Area hopes to improve 
toll facilities and may look at 
a possible re-doing and re­
routing of some. A feasibi­
lity study is now underway 
on this problem. “ The gov­
ernment tells us what to do, 
but not how,” the manager 
stated.

The membership was also 
told that a visit had been 
paid to Five Area by four

AT and T personnel recent­
ly, which was termed as a 
first ever in the history of 
the Cooperative.

Other plans for 1984 in­
clude a mobile system for 
the Maple area. Following 
the manager’s report, a 
drawing was held for door 
prizes, which was donated 
by various merchants in 
Muleshoe and others with 
whom the Cooperative does 
business. At least 30 door 
prizes were awarded to the 
lucky ticket holders.

Following the drawing, 
the membership was treated 
to a lunch catered by the 
Corral Catering Service.

Brothers...
Con’t from Page 1
proper livestock evaluation 
techniques, efficient cattle 
feeding and production 
methods, principles of econ­
omics and money manage- 
,ment.

The calf scramble pro­
gram typifies the purposes 
and goals of the Houston 
Livestock Show and Rodeo.

m i m m i i m i m i m i i n m m i n H i i m i f • •

Motor Oil

Always a crowd-pleasing 
event at the Houston Rodeo, 
the caff scramble allows the 
viewing public to see first­
hand what the Houston 
Livestock Show and rodeo is 
all about.

Headquarters

_  "UUNf

* k'ScSriT  T  |/cvw»B:V Ti j c T  >  'hC«!wniw
T lIIC O  n  ™

HAVOLltf/ Hgo u ]fMOTOROK i *****

Havollns Motor (Ml
10W40 S u p r e m e .....................1.05 Q T .

10W30 S u p r e m e .....................1.05 Q T .

30W H e a v y  D u t y ..................  .97 Q T

20W H e a v y  D u t y ...............  .97 Q T .

D e x tro n  I I ..................................1.02 QT

A T F  T y p e  F ........................ 1-02 Q T .
____ i* ai**f

Kfsi1

HOURS: 
MONSAT.. 10-8 

SUN., 10 7

Pipeline...
Con’t from Page 1 
to be designed to transport 
20 to 25 million tons of low 
sulfur coal per year as a 
water-based slurry. State 
law requires that the RRC 
issue a certificate of public 
convenience and neccessity 
to a company before it can 
build a coal transportation 
pipeline in Texas.

Some of the issues invol­
ved for the RRC’s consider­
ation include: whether the 
proposed pipeline will pro­
vide transportation more 
economically or efficiently 
than existing facilities; 
whether the company’s pro­
posed rates and charges are 
just, reasonable and nondis- 
criminatory; and whether 
the company will properly 
use and dispose of nondis- 
chargeable water and take 
over measures to protect the 
enviomemnt, subject to re­
commendations by the 
TACB and the TDWS.

The ESTI’s original pro­
posed plans were to build 
about 11 miles of the pipe­
line in Lamb County at a 
cost of approximately $79 
million. Lamb County offi­
cials estimated a possible 
$1.1 million annually in ad 
valorem taxes.

The ESTI application is 
the first application for a 
coal slurry pipeline the 
Commission has received 
since the Texas legislature 
gave it jurisdiction over such 
lines in 1977. The ESTI 
estimates the overall project 
will include some 1,800 
miles of pipeline, more than 
half of which would be built 
in Texas. Construction costs 
have been estimated at $3 
billion.

After considering the 
points made at the confer­
ence on February 17 and in 
the briefs, the examiners 
will issue an order identify­
ing the parties to the case, 
developing a system of pro­
cedural steps and deadlines 
necessary to process the 
application. Hearings will 
also be scheduled on the 
matter and will be reported 
by the Journal as they are 
made available.

Horticulture...
Con’t from Page 1
partment of Horticulture at 
Texas A&M University, will 
do the instructing in the 
course. Williamson holds 
B.S. and M.S. degrees in 
Agricultural Education.

The short course at Three 
Way is scheduled to begin 
Feb. 20th at 7:00 p.m. in the 
Vocational Agriculture 
Building. During the dates 
the short course is in pro­
gress, Mrs. Williamson will 
be available to assist en- 
rollees with individual pro­
blems and to provide 
on-the-farm and in the home 
instruction.

Persons interested in 
attending the short course 
should call or write the 
Teacher of Vocational Agri­
culture, Kermit R. Williams 
II, Horticulture Short Course 
Certificates will be present­
ed to enrollees who attend 
all four of the training ses­
sions.

m

Ruin in...
Con’t from Page 1 
distinguished themselves in 
their homes, their profess­
ions and their communities. 
Accomplishments such as 
these are the result of de­
dication, service and leader­
ship • qualities which de­
serve to be recognized and 
remembered.

The Women listed, along 
with approximately 23,000 
fellow Outstanding Young 
Women of America from 
across the United States, 
will be presented in the 
prestigious annual awards 
volume. In addition, they 
are now being considered 
for one of the fifty-one state 
awards to be presented to 
those women who have 
made the most noteworthy 
contributions in their indi­
vidual states. From these 
fifty-one state winners, the 
Ten Outstanding Young 
Women of American will be 
chosen. The ten national
winners will then be honor­
ed at the annual awards 
lucheon to be held this fall 
in Washington, D.C.

Our Board of Advisors 
and Editors salutes all those 
honred as Outstanding 
Young Women of America. 
We take great pride in 
bringing their accomplish­
ments to the attention of the 
American public.

The Journal has been 
authorized to announce 
the following candidates 
for public office:

SHERIFF
Tom Watson 

Bob Henderson

Tox
Assessor/Collector
Kathleen Hayes

State Senator
Bill Sarpanlis

U.S. Congress
Don R.Riehards 
T omM.Riehards
Co. Commissioner 

Precinct 1

R,L. Scott 
G.L/Hoss’Gibson 
R. O. Gregory

Marshall‘Catfish’ 
Williams.

~o. Commissioner 

Precinct 3

James Warren 
Joey Kindle

r  i
S T O P  

t  A
1709 Mabry Dr.
. {Across From Rodeway Inn) a

Phone: 763-7976-

TEC...
Con’t from Page l 
Office is a drawing card lor 
new industry, businesses re­
ceive many benefits and free 
services through the TEC 
office, businesses, employ­
ers and workers profit from 
the vital services provided.

"Local support has kept 
the office open in Muleshoe 
and we feel that you do not 
want to lose this valuable 
asset to our community, 
stated the local TEC Repre­
sentative.

“ State in your letter what 
this office means to you and 
the community and why you 
want it to remain open,” he 
suggested. Send your letter 
no later than February 10th 
to Mr. Day, as the decision 
is supposed to be made on 
February 14.

Et. Worth...

* * * *
The lucky man is the 

one who forgets his bad 
luck.

Cont. From Page I 
third with his heavy weight 
Polled Hereford steer, while 
his brother, Greg placed
13th with his heavy weight 
Cross Bred steer.

Jay Gleason, son of Dr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Gleason 
placed eighth with a heavy 
weight Cross Bred Steer and 
Sharia Morrison, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Herman 
Morrison placed 20th with a 
heavy medium weight 
Crossbred Steer. Jamie
Wheeler, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Wheeler also plac­
ed 20th with a heavy weight 
Cross Bred.

A group of 4-H youth and 
parents left for San Antonio 
for the show there on Tues­
day, and will show cattle on 
Saturday and Sunday. This 
is a two week show, so re­
sults will be called into the 
Journal by Tanksley, if and 
when the Bailey County 
youth place.

*  4* m

PLAINS
PRIDE
Thousands of corn acres prove this 
pair from Pioneer is doing some­
thing right.
3186
Over the pusl ihree years in on-farm tests in this 
area, no hybrid Iras produced a higher average yield 
than this one. However, it’s the extras that make 
3186 ideally suited lor irrigated Plains production.
Drouth tolerance— malting the most of weather and 
moisture conditions. Plus excellent stalk strength, out­
standing late season plant health, very good ear reten 
lion Disease resistance A  tall semi-upright-leafed hybrid, 
3186 normally produces large, girthy ears with excellent shuck 
cover, for either grain or silage production.

3184
It provides protection against diseases and stress and consistently 

produces excellent yields In fact, in over 300 on-farm yield tests 
in this area during the past seven years. 3184's average yield 

has been almost 700 lbs A. more than competitive hybrids. 
But, it’s under lough growing conditions that 3184 really 

shines Exceptional root and stalk strength Shorter 
growth habit, relatively low ear placement, late season 

plant health and excellent stay-green qualities. It's 
often used as the measure for standability in this 

area. Preferred bv food corn processors because 
of excellent grain quality and shuck cover. ,

Plant ’em together. They’ll give great 
yields in the good years and make 

the most of the tough years, too. 
Come on in and let’s talk.

^G ene  Paul Jarman
PIONEER SEEDS

965-2340

T H E
f  ( i l i l r l l l i l L

ON
-  A T A R I  C A R T R I D G E S

Quaker State Motor Oil
D e lu x e  10W40 

Super B lend 10W30 

D e lu x e  20W50  

S ter l in g  10W40 

30W H e a v y  D u ty

No Bids Accepted After 5:00 
On Monday, Feb. 13th 

Bids Will Be Posted At 12:00 

Noon On Tuseday, Feb. 14th
Pennzoll Motor Ml

10W30 ........... ..............  1.04 QT.
low40............................. "1-08 QT.
20W50GT P e rfo rm a n c e  1.12 QT.
30WT................................. .98 QT

MYiSC xJT-8 Motor Oil H

• •

| NAME 
I ADDRESS.It

l! PHONE

t CARTRIDGE a m o u n t .

BID COUPON

Star Voyager 
Venture 
St3r Raiders 
E T
Barnstorming 
Endure 
Spider Man 
Trick Sfiot 
Gran Prix 
Fire FighteTs 
Haunted Housa 
Yars Revenge <» 
Keystone Kapers* 
Plague Attack'3*  
Backgammon t

A Cosmic Ark 
Sky Diver 
Tape Worm

T if. -1 acTne

ATARI
Oink

•  Star Wars
Atlantis 
Spac« War 
Warlords 

® Ber^|r*

Air-Sea Battle 
wQ.l Luggage 
Bridge
?60D*Codebfeake'
Home-Run
Phoenix
Super Breakout 
Night Driver 
Star Voyager 
Asteroids

M n i i i i i i J i i i i m m i n i n i i n i i m i i t i i i n i

Auction Held On Valentine s Day
* Tuesday. February 14th
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DEADLINE FOR CLASSIFIED 
ADS IS TUESDAYS AND  

FRIDAYS 11:00AM
e q u i t y  ta lly

Muleslioe Hoy On Judging Team

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1 st Insertion 

Per Word....$.15 
Minimum Charge...$2.30 

2nd Insertion 
Per Word....$.13 

Minimum Charge...$2.00 
CARD OF THANKS 

Per Word....$.20 
CLASSIFIED DISPLAY 

$1.70..per column inch 
BLIND AD RATES 

50% more 
DEADLINES 

11 a.m. Tues forThurs.
11 a.m. Fri. for Sun.

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO CLASSIFY REVISE OR 

REJECT ANY AD. 
NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR 
ANY ERROR AFTER AD 

HAS RUN ONCE.

1. PERSONALS

Custom Farming Work 
done. Call 272-5327 after 6
p.m.
l-6t-tfc

Own your own Jean-Sports- 
wear. Ladies Apparel, Com­
bination, Accessories, Large 
Size store. National brands: 
Jordache, Chic, Lee, Levi, 
Vanderbilt, Izod, Gunne Sax, 
Esprit, Brittania, Calvin 
Klein, Sergio Valente, Evan 
Picone, Claiborne, Members 
Only, Bill Blass, Organically 
Grown, Healthtex, 300 
others. $7,900 to $24,900, 
inventory, air fare, training, 
fixtures, grand opening, etc. 
iMr. Loughlin 
(612) 888-6555. 
l-6t-ltpts

— f l W E K m —
about someone's 

drinking
HELP IS AVAILABLE 

through Al-Anon 
Call 227-2350 or 965-2870 or 
come to visit Tuesday 
nights. 8:00 p.m. at 1116 W. 
American Boulevard, Mule- 
shoe._________ __________

3. HELP WANTED

Farmer Seed Dealer Want­
ed; Write Box 16343 Lub­
bock, Tx. 79490. 
h3-6s-2tc

4. HOUSES FOR RENT

House for rent, 2 bedroom, 
partially furnished.
Call 272-3885. 
a4-6s-2tc

For Rent 2 bedroom houses 
call 965-2655 or (George 
Nieman). 
s4-6t-tfc

SKIING IS GREAT 
Save $$. Nice 2 Bedroom 
Ruidoso House, Cable T.V. 
Steve Alldredge 806 
456-7192. or Bob Allredge 
806 983-2912.
4-ls-tfc

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

3 Bedroom, 1 bath, paneled, 
fully carpeted, aluminium 
siding, storm windows, stor­
age building. Call 272-5415. 
18-6t-2tc

For Sale, 1 acre up to 10 
acres for country building 
site. Low down payment 
easy terms. Within 3'/a mile 
to town. Phorie 272-3692. 
s58-6s-5tc

Farmhouse For Sale 3 br, 1 
bath, double garage, on 5 
acres, 12 x 24 storm cellar, 2 
wells. 3 miles south and 3 
miles east of Enochs. Call 
806-385-3572.
8-6t-4tp

Bingham & Nieman 
Realty

116 E. Ave. C 
272-5285 • • •  272-5286

“ We Appreciate 
Your Business!

George A Dianne 
Nieman

AFTER
DEADLINE???

You can call 272-4536 

until 5:00 p.m. 

on Friday and Tuesday 

and get your WORD AD 

in

T00-LATE-T0 

in the next issue!!! 

Tuesday for Thursday 

and Friday for Sunday.

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

For Sale 80 acres near town 
good 6” well, underground 
pipe, side roll sprinkler, 
very small down payment, 
take up the payments. Call 
205-773-2000 or in evening 
& weekends 205-773-3757. 
8-6t-4tp

111 W. Ave. B 
Muleshoe 
272-4581

315 Acres on HWY West 
of Muleshoe, 5 Wells, 
Underground Pipe, Lays 
Excellent, Owner Fi­
nancing.

800 Acres West of Mule­
shoe on HWY Excellent 
Improvements. Priced 
Right to Sell. Owner 
Financing.

38 Acres West of 
Muleshoe, 6 Inch Well, 
Sideroll, All Wheat.

One Acre Sites For Home 
Construction. 3 Miles 
East of Muleshoe on 
HWY.

2 Bedroom Home. 4 
Rooms Rem^Aled, Stor- 
age C^Vt'kV'VJ % down 
Owner ^Vancing.

8-51s-tfc

9. AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE

New Listing 
For Sale By Owner:

3 Br, 1 Bath, 1 Car Garage, 
Central Heat, Comer Lot 
Priced to Sell.

402 E. Austin St. 
272-4738

3-41t- tfc

KREBBS REAL ESTATE
(I

If it’s Real Estate you 
rant, we have it or can getj

i
-Appraisals- 

|Tele. 272-3191-office anclJ
j residence.

For Sale 1983 Blazer Silver­
ado package, Loaded, ask­
ing $13,000. 704 W. Ave. K 
272-3612. 
tltc f9-6s-3tc

For Sale, 1977 Jeep 
Cherokee Chief, NADA 
Wholesale, 1972 Toyota 
Corella $500 Good Work car 
272-3204. 
s9-6s-tfc

Buy Factory Direct. Light­
weight fiberglass Scamp 13’ 
and 16’ travel trailers & new 
19’ 5th wheel. Call now toll 
free 1 -800-346-4962 for free 
brochure and save! 
s9-6t-2tp

FOR SALE BY OWNER 
Large Brick Home on 10 
acres. Plus 32’ x 50’ insu­
lated shop building, small 
barn, fruit orchard, ex­
cellent well with sprinkler 
system. Locate 2‘/i miles 
from city limits. $93,500. 
Call 272-4957. 
m8-4s- tfc

NEW HOMES

No Down Payment 
Low Monthly Payment 

You May Qualify!

272-4266

A m e r i c a n  
V a l l e y

I n v es t m en t s ]
realtors

Thursie Reid 272-3142
Karen Harris 272-5183
Lucille Harp 272-4693
Derrell Matthews.965'2127 
Rex Harris 272-5183
8-2t-ttfc

10. FARM EQUIP. 
FOR SALE

J.B. SUDDERTH 
REALTY, INC 

Drawer 887 
Farwell, Tx. 79325 
Ph. 806-481-3288

160 Acre on Hwy. N.W. 
of Muleshoe, 2 wells. Ex­
cellent Financing. Priced 
for Immediate Sale.

320 Acre, 3-8 inch wells, 
1 Circle. Lays Excellent. 
Oklahoma Lane Area.

320 Acre, 1 Circle, 2-8 
inch wells, good water 
area. Oklahoma Lane 
Area.

480 Acres-irrigated with 
Circle Sprinklers, lays 
good, on highway-West of 
Muleshoe. Owner says 
sell!

50 acres in edge of Mule­
shoe 6 inch electric well. 
Barn, Corral, side roll 
sprinkler, City Water. 
Owner says Sell.

For Sale, 4 used Zimmatic 
center pivot sprinklers call 
965-2781. 
cl0-6s-3tc

Complete Propane System 
60 gal tank, hoses, fittings 
and century regulator. 
965-2356

FOR SALE: Avenger 3 
Wheel Hoe Hands with 
spray tanks attached. Call 
First National Bank. 
272-4515.
10-21 t-tfc

FOR SALE
In Line Booster Pump 25 
horse power.

90 Horse power Pearless 
standard gear head 4-3.

70 Horse power Pearless 
gear head 6-5.

100 Horse power Newman 
Electric Motor.
Call 806-272-4869. 
fl0-5s-lmc

11. FOR SALE 
OR TRADE

Hide-a-bed sofa and a pool 
table for sale. 272-4755. ' 
sil-6s-4tc

FOR SALE: Baled Milo 
stalks. Call 933-4324. 
d ll -5s-4tc

Pea-Green Hay FOR SALE 
In the Barn. Call 272-3842 or 
272-3692. 
si 1 -4s-tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 12 
x 64 Schult Chateau Trailor 
House. Phone 925-6710 or 
272-3735. 
ll-3s-4ttp

13. PROPERTY 
FOR LPASE

9. AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE

l

~ -T ~
Nice Vega, 2 door, Rebuilt 
Motor. New tires.
Call 272-4696. 
p3teOtc

Land for lease, irrigated and 
dry land. Phone 946-3472 
o!3-6s-2tc

Lazbuddie Independent 
School District is now Ac­
cepting application tor bus- 
driver, cafeteria, janitor po­
sition. Pick up application at 
Lazbuddie School or call 
965-2156.
!3-6t-ltc

PIANO FOR SALE 
Wanted: Responsible party 
to assume small monthly 
payments on spinet console 
piano, can be seen locally. 
Write (include phone num­
ber) Credit Manager, P.O. 
Box 478, Lockhart, Tx; 
78644-0478. 
ill-4t-6tcts

14. FARM PROPERTY 
TO RENT

For Rent Irrigated land 
mostly with sprinklers. H.M. 
Gable 10 miles northeast of 
Muleshoe, Phone 965-2601. 
gl4-6t-2tc

18 LEGAL NOTICES ]

15. MISCELLANEOUS

HONEY FOR SALE 
Nick Landers 

334 W. Ave. J. 
272-30%

15-5t-tfc

Bruce & Matthews Inc. Re­
frigeration & Electrical 
Contractor’s, Heating, Cool­
ing. Appliance service. 424 
N. First, 272-5114.
15-44t-tfc

HOME REPAIRS. F.M. 
Saldana Construction lic­
ensed and bonded plumber. 
Specialize in cement, car­
penter work, remodeling, 
painting, acoustical ceilings. 
272-4955.
15- 16s-tfc

Treflan $119.00 5 gal. can 
$697.00 30 gal. drum 

Call 806-272-4737 
Watson Chemical 
(Jimmy Watson)

For Any Chemical 
Will Deliver Substantial 
Order.
wl5-5t-3tc

Tree & Shrubery 
Trimming, Lawn 

Thatching,
Stump Removal. 

Dormant spraying & feed­
ing.
Custom Tree & Lands­
cape Service, Box 2704, 
Amarillo, Texas, 79102. 
373-4593. 
cl5-3t-8tc

♦ * * *
Public  sp e a k in g  is 

easy. It’s the thinking 
before you speak tha t’s 
hard.

* * * *
Always HiyIn 

An ex ecu tiv e  is a 
man who can make a 
decision and slick to i t -  
no m atter how wrong he 
is.

NOTICE FOR BIDS
The,Bailey County Com­

missioners’ Court will re­
ceive bids until 10 a.m., 
Monday, February 13th, 
1984, for the purchase of a 
new emergency medical 
care vehicle.

The minimum specifica­
tions for said vehicle are on 
file with the County Judge 
and copies thereof may be 
obtained from his office in 
the Bailey County Court­
house, by mail to P.O. Box 
589, Muleshoe, Texas 
79347, or by telephone at 
806-272-3077.

All bids must be submitt­
ed to the County Judge prior 
to the above time. Bailey 
County will offer in trade a 
1977 Chevrolet High Top 
Suburban which may be ex­
amined at Ellis Funeral 
Home. All bids shall reflect 
the gross sales price of the 
new vehicle, the allowance 
for the trade of the 1977 
Chevrolet Suburban, and 
the net amount of the bid.

The Commissioners' 
Court reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids and to 
waive formalities.

Gordon H. Green 
County Judge

g!8-3t-4ttc

* * * *
When a child, or an 

adult, gets the idea to 
play, vou might as well 
lot 'em  play.

* * * *
No greatness exists 

unless it 's  based upon 
principle and not upon 
profits.

* *  *  *

Som e peop le  a re  
never happier than when 
th e y 'r e  g e tt in g  o th e rs  
into difficulties.

Reached A Solution
A number of people 

have solved the problem 
of what to do with their 
re tire m e n t. They sit 
a ro u n d  and  cuss the  
governm ent.’

-Register. Mobile.

The NEW

NOTICE OF
RATE CHANGE REQUEST 

AND
STATEMENT OF INTENT 

Notice is hereby given 
that BAILEY COUNTY 
ELECTRIC COOPERATIVE 
ASSOCIATION (the “ Uti­
lity” ) intends to change its 
purchased power adjust­
ment for electric utility ser­
vice effective February 17, 
1984. Under the present tar­
iff the Utility pays an in­
centive credit to members of 
the irrigation class partici­
pating in a load manage­
ment program and addition­
ally credits all consumers 
with any reduction in power 
costs less demand ratchet 
cost resulting from load 
management. To correct this 
double payment of benefits 
the utility proposes to re­
cover 'A of the incentive cre­
dits actually paid through its 
power cost adjustment. The 
increase requested over test 
year revenues is $149,359.00 
or less than 2%.

The changes are applic­
able to all areas and all 
customers served by the Uti­
lity. The classes and num­
bers of Utility customers 
affected are as follows: 

Residential 2,734 
Irrigation 2,801 

Commercial
under 50 KVA 373 

Commerical 
over 50 KVA 78

Implementation of the 
proposed changes is subject 
to approval by the approp­
riate regulatory authority. A 
statement of intent includ­
ing the proposed revisions 
of tariff and schedules and a 
statement specifying in de­
tail each proposed change is 
available at the general 
office of the Utility located 
at 305 East Avenue B, 
Muleshoe, Texas.

Persons who wish to in­
tervene or otherwise partici­
pate in these proceedings 
should notify the Commis­
sion,as soon as possible. A 
request to intervene, parti­
cipate, or for further infor­
mation should be mailed to 
the Public Utility Commiss­
ion of Texas, 7800 Shoal 
Creek Boulevard, Suite 
400N, Austin, Texas 78757. 
Further information may al­
so be obtained by calling the 
Public Utility Commission 
Consumer Affairs Division 
at (512) 458-0223 or (512) 
458-0227, or (512) 458-0221 
teletypewriter for the deaf.

CAMPBELL McGINNIS 
ATTORNEY FOR THE UTI­
LITY
Mcl8-3t-4ttc

Literature is news that 
stays news.

505-762-6485  
3800 M abry Drive 
Clovis, New Mexico

Prices Good 

through Sat., Feb. 11

S ch aefer Beer

Discount 

Liquors

Case

1Pabst Case $JS9 |

1 M ichelob case *1 1 49 |

B ecks Light & D ark SC50 1

| W indsor *699 j

I M attingly & M oore 75 *1 1 "

el

Fleischm anns Vodka

LARGEST LINE OF IMPORTED BEER & WINES
• ,... . V -' ,
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Coors^ Bud, Schlitz, Michelob, Miller Lite, Lowaibrau

A Muleshoe graduate is a 
member of the Tarleton 
State University’s meat jud­
ging team that placed fifth 
in the National Western In­
tercollegiate Meat Judging 
Contest held recently in 
Denver, Co. Two individuals 
in the upper rankings.

Members of the TSU team 
are Devin Sisemore, Mule­
shoe; Travis Holder, Haltom 
City; Glynn Krueger, Hamil­
ton; and Wayne Ivey, Clint.

The Tarleton team placed 
third in lamb judging, fourth 
in specifications class, sixth 
in beef grading, and seventh 
in beef judging. Holder 
placed seventh in overall 
standings with a first place 
in lamb judging. Sisemore 
was third in beef grading.

Tarleton finished behind 
Texas Tech, Kansas State, 
South Dakota State, and 
Oklahoma State. Rounding 
out the 11-team meet were 
University of Wyoming, 
University of Nebraska, Tex­
as A&M University, Colo­
rado State, New Mexico 
State, and North Dakota 
State.

The contest was held at 
the Monfort Packing Co. in 
Greely, Co.

Randy Hines is advisor to

the team which will compete 
next at the Southwestern 
Exposition and Fat Stock 
Show at Fort Worth.

WHO KNOWS
1. Define renascent.
2. When was the first 
bicycle invented?
3. What was O. Henry's 
real name?
4. Who said: “ Politics 
are more difficult to 
u n d e r s t a n d  t h a n  
physics"?
5. Name the capital of 
Kentucky.
6. Who wrote: “ Never 
put off until tomorrow 
w hat you can do today"?

A n s w e r s  to  W h o  K n o w s

1. Being born again; 
showing renewed life, 
growth or vigor.
2. Reportedly in 1790. 
calling a walk-along.
3. Wi l l i a m S y d n e y  
Porter.
4. Dr. Albert Einstein.
5. Frankfort.
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n  A nd  get a FREE Buckle Q

Just for stopping by. S H & O J ra g |

R m  r~~~i i---- i r^ -i m  U

Gene Franks
925-6626

IMPROVED 
SORGHUMS

This year—let the new generation 
of hybrids do for your sorghum acres 
what Pioneer has done for Plains corn.
8 4 9 3
Especially adapted lor dryland or very limited 
water conditions, this is a last maturing hybrid with 
the ability to take full advantage of normal early sea­
son rainfall Then il makes efficient use of available 
ground moisture in produce all lhat the season allows.
Strong stalks and roots keep medium height plants stand­
ing straight for easy harvest 

8 3 3 3
1 his one has outstanding drouth tolerance, too— hut you should 
plant il on good dryland or under limited irrigation In take lull ad­
vantage of its maturity and yield potential The field appearance lit 

the bron/e, hard-textured grain is most attractive. Harvesting is 
made easy, too, by excellent head exsertion and very good 

slandahility I or late season plant health. 8333 is highly re- 
sislant In MUMV. head smut, and Hiotype C greenhugs.

8 2 2 2
for big yield potential under lull irrigation. A  widely 

adapted hybrid, 8222 has produced an outstanding 
record under many different environmental condi­

tions. Bui. it is especially adapted to full-season 
production in this area Provides outstanding 

stress tolerance, plus excellent resistance to 
M D M V  and head smut.

Choose the combination best 
suited to your land and your 

conditions and get ready for a 
great sorghum crop. Come 

in and let’s talk.i'MMLmtil

Francis Franks,
925-6454
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Windbreak School Finance Plan Proposal Released
On January 26, State 

Comptroller Bob Bullock re­
leased details of his propos­
ed school finance plan show­
ing how more Texas stu­
dents could benefit from 
state education aid “ without 
adding a single red penny in 
taxes.”

Bullock released computer 
printouts showing the finan­
cial impact of his plan on 
each of the state’s school 
districts.

The printouts show that at 
present funding levels, 52 
percent of the state’s 2.7 
million public school stu­
dents would benefit from 
more state aid with 
Bullock’s plan than under 
the state’s current system.
If the legislature chooses to 
devote another $200 million 
to school aid, 79 percent of 
the students would get 
more.

Still Available
It has been a long, cold Texas Nursery, "but w<

winter but the Texas Forest have a good supply ol
Service’s West Texas Nur- varieties of conifers v
sery still has a good we'll sell as long as the]
crop of healthy young coni- or until the end of pla
fer seedlings -  at bargain season which is arounc
prices -  ready to be pur- end of March.”
chased for planting by West Fewin said the cc 
Texans for farm and ranch species still available 
windbreaks. Austrian pine and pc

Several varieties of seed- rosa pine, both popular 
lings have been sold out, cies in West Texas, 
according to Robert Fewin, These 6- to 12- inch 
silviculturist for the West seedlings are grown in

Allas - Hot [mint - Magic ( ItcJ
>

; Rick's Repair Service
| Open For.Business: January 2, 1^84 
» To Repair All Small Appliances 

& Lawnmowers

Before late February.”
He said that when the 

contiainers of seedlings are 
purchased that they may be 
retained for several weeks 
before planting, if the weat­
her turns bad. “ When you 
are planting bare root seed­
lings, the roots must be kept 
moist until they are planted, 
and the roots cannot be 
allowed to freeze," he ex­
plained.

“ But when the seedlings 
are containerized — like our 
conifers -- they can be kept 
for several weeks with a 
minimum of protective mea­
sures, such as being kept in 
a barn or garage, until the 
weather allows planting,” 
he added.

The Styrafoam containers, 
however, are not designed 
for shipping, so buyers must 
make a trip to designated 
pick-up points.

Windbreak planters may 
not use these seedlings for 
landscaping or ornamental 
purposes. West Texans in­
terested in planting the 
seedlings for homestead, 
feedlot, field or wildlife 
windbreaks, however,
should write for seedling 
applications: West Texas 
Nursery, Texas Forest Ser­
vice, Rt. 3, Box 216, Lub­
bock, Texas 79401, or call 
(806) 746-5801. Seedlings 
will be sold on a first-come 
basis until the end of the 
planting season or the 
supply is exhausted.

if you have already plant­
ed windbreaks and have 
young trees which you think 
mav have been frozen and 
suffering from “ tip burn,” 
don’t be in too great a hurry 
to prune the suspected froz­
en growth, Fewin advises. 
“ Wait until late May before 
pruning, because some ~c 
the growth that appt 
‘freeze burned' will cc 
back,”  he added.

Bailey County reside 
may pick up their orders 
March 8 from 8 to 5 p.m. ^  
the TA ES near Lubbock > ’ 
FM 1294._

LUNG CANCER
Lung cancer will exceed 

breast cancer as the leading 
cause of death from cancer 
among women in 1984, Dr. 
Vincent DeVita Jr., director 
of the National Cancer Insti­
tute said recently.

vidual cells, 30 cells to the 
Styrofoam container in the 
Lubbock greenhouse. A 
minimum order is 30 seed­
lings (one container) or in 
multiples of 30, for $30 per 
30 trees, plus 4% state sales 
tax.

The containers are 12 
inches wide by 14 inches 
long, by 8 inches deep, and 
several containers can easily 
be transported in the back 
seat of a car or pickup cab.

The West Texas Nursery 
grows windbreak seedlings 
for High Plains and Pan­
handle counties, north of 
Big Spring and west of 
Wichita Falls.

"When you have a good 
many days when the chill 
factor is below zero,” Fewin 
said, “ it is too disagreeable 
to be out planting trees or 
anything else, but even in a 
normal winter tree planting 
rarely starts in West Texas

MULESH0E TRADE CENTER

New Furniture Too Expensive? 

See John For Good Used 

Furniture
(Aain 272-4906

Rick T. Galt, Owner 
Maple (806) 927-5508
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"M en 's Sizes Now At Super Savings

MEN'S LEVI SADDLEMAN............... .1
WRANGLER BOOT CUT.............. 13.8
WRANGLER STRAIGHT 10 QO A

LEG.....................13.88 A
WRANGLER _  M

COWBOY CUT..........15.88 1

m ile
Supplies

Last

mm m
Supplies Last ■

Moist and Dry Heating Pad
Sponge included for moist heat 
3heatsettings, on"light 1819 

Quantities Limited

Enameled Wood 
Toilet Seat
Dial-On™ hinges tor easy in­
stallation Colors 40DCMX 

Quantities Limited

16-0z. Nail Hammer
High carbon steel claw hammer 
with hickory handle 3-16-HFN 

Quantities Limited

Reduced Now

LADIES TOPS & BLOUSES
272-4511

ADDITIONAL VALUES THURSDAY, FRIDAY & SATURDAY

Clirstrrfirlb

FOLGER'S

INSTANT
COFFEE

sale
Men’s Anthony’s" Dress Slacks, reg. 
16.99. 100% polyester with western 
top pockets. Basic colors, sizes 32- 
42 Men’s large sizes 44-50 • 18.99.

sale m
Boys’ Hobie Long Sleeve Screen 
Print T-Shirts, reg. $12. Crew neck 
polyester-cotton shirts in fun colas 
with popular screens, Sizes $,M,L,XL

sale I  mm
Women’s Chesterfield" Knit Tops, 
reg. $15.50% polyester, 50% cotton 
jersey or interlock knit tops Fashion 
solids or stripes for sizes S,M,L‘

M o rn in g  ( . lo r y

HASTA REG. OR DIET

sale I A
Morning Glory Full or Queen Size 
Mattress Pads, reg. 14.99 and 16 99.
50% polyester, 50% cotton with # i 
grade polyester fill. Machine wash

Men’s ATB Stretch Denim Jeans, 
reg. $18.45% cotton, 24% polyester, 
and 31% Rayon1" for the comfort of 
stretch Dark denim, sizes 28 38

Men’s Short 8 Long Sleeve Ocean  
Pacific Screen Print T-Shirts. 100% 
cotton shirts in assorted colas with 
vivid screen prints. Siz’es S.M.L.XL.

__________ Spring Fashion Stop riu

IaI In ] firl [H i [ol In ] IyHQUALITY AND SERVICE
W e A c c e p t

515 West American

TOOL VALUE
OF THE MONTH

Master
PLUMBED
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