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Bill Durham, a 1976 
graduate of Muieshoe High 
School, has been admitted 
to the Masters Degree Pro­
gram in Creative Writing at 
New York University. He 
will pursue graduate work 
under the direction of Pul­
itzer prize-winning poet 
Galway Kinnell and novel­
ist Robert Stone. Durham 
graduated magna cum 
laude from Texas Tech 
University in 1980 with a 
B.A. degree in English and 
Theatre Arts. His wife Jana 
is the daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Milton Oyler of 
Muieshoe.

At a recent school board 
meeting recognition was 
given to the Muieshoe 
FFA Boosters for their 
most recent accomplish­
ment -  payment-in-full on 
the 1980 Suburban pur­
chased for the Ag Depart­
ment. “ It is certainly just 
one more indication of the 
fine support our community 
is giving to our school," 
san! School Superintendent 
John Fuller.

Sean Mason and Mark 
Lust, both Lezbuddie FFA 
Chapter members recently 
received their Lone Star 
Fanner degrees at the an­
nual Texas FFA Convention 
held in San Antonio. Laz- 
budd'ia Vo-Ag Instructor 
Rick Copp accompanied the 
students.

City Sales ‘83 Tax Rebate 
Increase Nears 6 Percent

July Period ‘Up’ 
From 1982 Receipts

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Muieshoe Little League 
Wins Local Tournament

CHECKING FOR HARVEST..... Nick Bamert explained the methods used to determine the
readiness of grass at harvest time to visitors on the annual ag tour here Tuesday. Show in 
the photo also are the two instructors who accompanied the group on their tour.

School Board Initiates 
New Policies For District

The 1983-84 Budget 
Hearing for the Suc.ti In­
dependent School District 
will be held Monday, Aug­
ust 8, 1983 at 8:90 p.m., in 
the school administrative 
'office.

t i t
Deadline for entry into 

the "Jack and Jill" softball 
league will be July 22, Fri­
day. Entry fees are S25 and 
the season is scheduled to 
begin on July 26 running 
through August. For furt­
her information contact 
Evelyn Pope at 272-4023.

In a recent Board of 
Trustees meeting for the 
Muieshoe Independent 
School District held July 
11, a number of business 
items were up for appro,al. 
Approved was the “ Use of 
Facilities”  policy changes 
which were outlined last 
raon’h. The board also 
proved new and noised 
policies presented by the 
Texas Association of School 
Boards Policy Service.

A new student accident 
insurance program was ap­
proved by board members. 
The new program will ex­
pand the accident coverage 
beyond the current policy 
which covers only football 
players to include all junior 
high and high school par­
ticipants in any athleric 
event. Also included in the 
package will be the oppor­
tunity to purchase accident

Jennyslippers Donate 
To Baseball Program

The Muieshoe Wom­
en’s Division of the Cham­
ber of Commerce and Ag­
riculture met Tuesday, July 
12 at the Miniature Golf 
patio for a regular meeting 
combined with a home 
made ice cream social with 
families of members being 
guests.

A special guest. Buddy 
Blackman, gave a brief 
background of the Mule- 
shoe Baseball program. 
The program began in 1954 
and has grown to the ex­
tent that about 300 boys in 
the area are involved in 
some part of the program

in 1983. Blackman present­
ed to the Jennyslippers a 
need for financial help to 
sponsor the State Tourna­
ment scheduled to be held 
in Muieshoe this month. 
Blackman accepted a dona­
tion on behalf of the Base­
ball Program from the Jen­
nyslippers in the amount of 
S250. The funds are ear­
marked for the Babe Ruth 
League and further help 
was discussed for the Girls 
Softball.

It was noted by members 
present that the entertain-
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insurance at a rate of $12 
for school time only and 
$38 for 24 hour coverage. 
Further details on the new 
insurance program will be 
released when school 
starts.

The property insurance 
program which was sub­
mitted by the Texas Assoc­
iation of School Boards was
approved.

Upon the recommenda­
tion and proposal by John 
Fuller, school superinten­
dent, the Board Members 
unanimously approved an 
increase in the graduation 
requirements at Muieshoe 
High School. This new re­
quirement will include the 
mastery of the Texas As­
sessment of Basic Skills 
(TABS). Superintendent 
Fuller stated that this is 
only one step in the ’’right 
direction” toward improv­
ing student achievement. 
The new requirement is 
scheduled to begin with the 
1985 graduating class. It 
was noted that students 
with educational handicaps 
are exempted from the 
(TABS) requirement.

The Muieshoe Indepen­
dent School Board also 
approved a proposal not to 
increase student lunch pri­
ces for the coming year, 
and a tax collection report 
from the Bailey County 
Appraisal District was 
approved.

Approval of 1983-84 sal­
aries for school personnel 
was given by the Board 
Members following a pre­
sentation by Superintendent 
Fuller. Fuller pointed out 
to board members that the
mtal salaries #»Tn#»nd*d

year will b t at the same 
level or slightly less than 
last ’ears. This savings, 
according »o Fuller, came 
about by the planning of 
both school board and ad­
ministration, and as a re­
sult of the failure of the 
s‘ate legislature to mandate
Cor.’t on Page 6, Col. 1

Muleshoe’s 11-12 year 
old All-Stars from the 
Bronco League of Little 
League Baseball won their 
own tournament in Mule- 
shoe last week by defeating 
Friona following four nights 
of action.

On Monday night, the 
Muieshoe “ Black” team 
defeated the Friona “ Blue” 
team and the Friona 
“ Red” team downed the 
Muieshoe “ Gray” team.

Then, on Tuesday night, 
the Muieshoe "Gray” team 
downed the Friona “ Blue” 
team, eliminating the 
“ Blue" team from the 
tournament. The other 
Muieshoe team.
“ Black” team also 
their 8 p.m. game, 
ing the Friona 
team.

Thursday night,
Friona “ Red” team was 
back in the tournament 
after taking the Muieshoe 
“ Gtay”  team down to de­
feat and eliminating them 
from the tourney.

In the championship 
game Friday night, the 
Muieshoe “ Black” team 
won the game and the 
district title, by defeating 
flie Friona "Red” team.

Muleshoe’s "Black” 
team advanced to regional 
action and will play in 
Amarillo, beginning Mon­
day, July 25. In their first 
game, they will play El 
Paso at 7:30 p.m.

Win or lose, the Mule- 
shoe ‘ Black” team will 
again play in the regional 
tournament in Amarillo on 
Tuesday, July 26 at 7:30 
p.m.

Members of the All-Star 
team include: Michael Dun­
ham, Kim Gray, Kevin 
King, David Sanders and 
Jeff Hicks, all of the Sox 
team; Shawn Rejino from 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 6

Figures just released 
from Bob Bullock, Comp­
troller of Public Accounts 
in Austin indicate that 
Muieshoe and Bailey 
County has the largest in­
crease in city sales rebates 
for the period ending on 
July 8, 1983. Muleshoe's 
rebates to date show to be 
5.83 percent up over the 
same period of time in 
1982. Most other surround­
ing cities and counties 
show a definite deficit.

Net payments to Mule- 
shoe for the period just 
ended totaled $9,183.88 
and $9,304.81 for the com­
parable payment in 1982. 
However, 1983 payments to 
date for Muieshoe totaled

the
won

defeat-
“ Ued”

the

Local Police Chief 
Attends FBI School

First National Bank 
Deposit Total Changed

%
\

P

WATER MAKES THE DIFFERENCE..... Youthful agriculturists from 14 different countries
were fascinated with the spectacle of the pivot irrigation systems on the Bamert Seed 
Farms near Muieshoe. The visit to the farms was a scheduled part of an ag education trip 
for the youth, most of wh« m work in some form or phase of agriculture related business in 
their home countries.

Deposit totals for the 
June 30, 1983 bank state 
ment of condition shown in 
the Sunday. July 17 Jour­
nal were incomplete for the 
First National Bank of 
Muieshoe due to the exclu­
sion of a total demand de­
posit figure inadvertantly 
left out.

Total deposits for the 
First National Bank should 
have reflected $29,195,367, 
in lieu of the $23,660,154 
shown in the Sunday arti­
cle. Total deposits for the 
two local banks should 
have been shown at 
$61,682,367, instead of the 
$56,147,154 reported.

The additional deposit 
figure brings total deposits 
for the June 30. 1983 bank 
call for eight area banks to 
$191,859,913 instead of the 
$186,324,700 shown in the 
story.

Deposit amounts record­
ed for the remaining banks 
mentioned in the story 
were as follows: Muieshoe 
State - $32,487,000; First 
State Bank, Morton - 
$26,058,352; Security State, 
Farwell - $29,873,321; Citi­
zens State, Earth -

Local Girl 
Named To NHS 
In Nursing

Lauri Burgess, a nursing 
student at West Texas 
State University from 
Muieshoe, has become a 
new member of Sigma 
Theta Tau, national honor 
society in nursing.

Burgess is one of 15 new 
members of the Delta Delta 
Chapter at WTSU.

Sigma Theta Tau was
founded in 1922 to promote 
professional standards aca­
demic achievement and 
leadership qualities in
nursing. The society in­
cludes about 64.000 mem­
bers or about five percent 
of the 1.4 million registered 
nurses licensed in the U- 
nited States.

Students arc selected for 
membership based on
scholarship and demon­
strated ability in nursing. 
Community nurse leaders 
are selected for achieve-
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$11,918,180; Friona State 
Bank, Friona - $38,212,697; 
First State Bank, Bovina - 
$15,261,000 and First Nat­
ional Bank, Sudan - 
$8,853,996. _____

The TCAA will sponsor a 
wrestling benefit featuring 
Ricky Romero vs. Super 
Destroyer along with one 
other match on Thursday, 
July 21 at 8 p.m. in the 
Bailey County Coliseum. 
Ringside admission is $6, 
general is $5 and children 
under age 13, $3. All bene­
fits will go to the American 
Cancer Society.

Muleshoe’s Chief of Po­
lice Leslie D. Irvin is cur­
rently attending the 134th 
Session of the FBI National 
Academy, along with 250 
fellow law enforcement of­
ficers at Quanrico, Virginia 
according to an announce­
ment to the Journal by FBI 
Director William H. 
Webster.

Dave Marr, Muieshoe 
City Manager, told the 
Journal on Monday that Ir­
vin had been selected after 
applying to the school and 
that the genera! feeling of 
the City Officials was that 
Irvin's new training could 
help to upgrade the city’s 
leadership. Marr also stat­
ed that all expenses in­
curred by Irvin would be 
re-imbursed by the FBI.

Each of the 50 states will 
be represented as well as 
several other provinces, 
military organizations and 
civilian organizations. Ele­
ven foreign countries will 
be represented.

Webster said the 11- 
week management-level 
training session would in­
clude instruction in the 
field of education and com­
munication arts, forensic

and behavioral sciences, 
police management, law, 
firearms and physical 
training.

A total of 17,138 officers 
have graduated from the 
FBI National Academy 
since its inception in July, 
1935. Nearly 12,000 grad­
uates are still active in law 
enforcement and of this 
rumber, approximately one 
of every eight occupies the 
top executive position of 
his or her agency.

“ The FBI Nadonal Acad­
emy exists to provide the 
finest professional training 
possible to carefully select­
ed career law enforcement 
officers.” Mr. Webster 
said. “ Those chosen to at­
tend have shown the dedi­
cation, confidence and pro­
fessionalism necessary to 
derive the maximum bene­
fits from this enriched 
training program. Officers 
with these exceptional 
qualities have traditionally 
been identified with the 
FBI National Academy. By 
their achievements and de­
votion to the highest prin­
ciples of law enforcement, 
graduates throughout the 
world have demonstrated 
the value of this training.”

Foreign Agriculturists 
Visit Bamert Seed Farms

Twenty young foreign 
agriculturists from fourteen 
different countries stopped 
in Muieshoe on Tuesday, 
July 19 as a part of a ten 
week agriculture instruct­
ional tour of the United 
States. Their destination in 
the Muieshoe area was the 
2000 acre Bamert Seed 
Farms where they were 
taken on a guided tour by 
farm manager Nick Bamert 
and owner Carl Bamert. 
They explained the various 
seed varieties grown, their 
purpose and prospective 
usage. Many of the visitor- 
were fascinated with the 
irrigation system of the 
farms and close inspection 
was allowed of center pivot 
rigs.

Most of the young visit­
ors who from developing 
countries, are farm 
consultants and managers, 
seed specialists, agrono­
mists and the equivalent of 
our own county agents. 
They are involved in live­
stock, seed, feed and food 
production in such coun­
tries as Thailand, Senegal, 
Indonesia. Zambia, Yemen, 
Upper Voltr and Nigeria. A 
number of the agriculturists 
are currently attending un­
iversities in the United 
States, working towards 
some kind of degree in ag 
related subjects.

The group, traveling by 
charter bus had just come

from New Mexico and are 
on their way to Oklahoma 
and then on to Indiana. 
They were accompanied 
Tuesday by Dr. Charles 
Vaughan, Professor of 
Agronomy at Mississippi 
State University, who is 
their official tour coordina­
tor and by Norman Hopp­
er, Associate Professor in 
the Texas Tech Department 
of Plants and Science.

Bamert Seed Farms have

been in operation since 
1952, when they first got 
their start in the soil bank 
program era. The farms 
produce many types of 
range grasses and improv­
ed grazing and hay varie­
ties such as sideoats, 
buffalo, Indiangrass and 
blue grama for itse in arid 
and semi-arid areas.

Because many of the 
developing countries repre-
Cont. Page 6, Col. 4

$111,146.43 for this period, 
as compared to the 
$105,024.99 of 1982. Thus, 
the 5.83 percent increase to 
date.

Bullock sent checks tot­
aling $33.1 million to 974 
cities that levy the one 
oercent city sales tax last 
Thursday. “ Our total pay­
ments tc cities so far this 
year are still running about 
one percent behind last 
year,” Bullock said. "Tex­
as was slow to e:4er the 
national recession and we 
are still lagging behind in 
the recovery. Most major 
Texas cities are beginning 
to show higher tax receipts 
than last year, but the 
border and oil and gas 
producing areas are still 
substantially behind.”

in Cochran County’s city 
of Morton, sales tax re­
bates were not in compar­
able with Muieshoe. Mor­
ton received a net payment 
this period in the amount 
of $1700.70 - a large drop 
from the $2,244.80 at the 
same time in 1982. Total 
payments to date for Mor­
ton amount to $22,550.76, a 
hefty 13.01 percent less 
than the $15,922.02 of 
1982.

The City of Dir.imitt in 
Castro County received a 
net payment tor the July
period of $7,563.58, down 
from the $7,468.29 of 1982. 
Payments to date for Dim- 
mitt in 1983 have reached 
$70,396.20, bu* still remain 
7.80 percent behind the 
$76,350.63 recorded at this 
time in 1982.

Hereford in Deaf Smith 
County, was one of the 
cities close-by that showed 
an actual increase in re­
bates for this period. Here­
ford received their check in 
the amount of $18,780.68 
for the July period, down 
from the $23,565.07 com­
parable payment in 1982. 
However, the 1983 pay­
ments to date for Htreford 
Cont. Page 6, Col. 6

Rotary Club 
Hears Cannon 
AFB Officer

Members of the Mule- 
shoe Rotary Club met at 
noon on Tuesday at the 
Bailey County Civic Center. 
Paul Wilbanks was in char­
ge of the program and pre­
sented Lt. Wells who is in 
charge of Public Relations 
at Cannon Air Force Base 
in Clovis, New Mexico. Lt. 
Wells gave a slide presen­
tation of the F-ll and the 
duties of the 27th Tactical 
Fighter Wing. The 27th 
Tactical Fighter Wing is 
kept prepared to move 
anywhere in the world if 
necessary, upon a mom­
ent’s notice the PR officer
Cont. Page 6, Col. 5

A7-.VV DENTIST OFFICE OPENS..... Ribbon cutting ceremonies were held at II a.m
Tuesday morning in Muieshoe at the newly constructed offices of Dr. Tom Bond Mam 
Chamber representatives were present along with other well-wishers to net the 
operations off to a good start. new
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Local Woman \s 
Mother Dies 
In Lubbock

Three Way 
News

By
M n.H.W .Ga

HARLAN J. REESE

Reese Services 
Held Here 
Monday

Services for Harlan J. 
Reese, 66, were held at 3 
p.m. Monday, July 18 in 
the First Baptist Church 
with the Rev. J.E. Meeks, 
pastor, officiating.

Burial was in Littlefield 
Memorial Park under the 
direction of Ellis Funeral 
Home. Reese die*3 at 9:14 
p.m. Saturday at his home.

A native of Comanche 
County. Reese was born 
Dec. 30, 1916 and moved 
to Muleshoe in 1967 from 
Sudan where he had been 
a resident since 1929. He 
was a farmer and a mem­
ber of the Sudan Masonic 
Lodge. He married Irene 
Wall Brackman on March 
29, 1969, in Muleshoe.

Survivors include his 
wife, Irene; one son, Jim­
my Reese of Arlington, 
Texas; one step-son, Jerry 
Brackman of Euless; one 
step-daug\t« r, Mrs. Jewel- 
lene Scoggin of Alamogor­
do, N.M.; two sisters, Mrs. 
Jackie Martin of Upland, 
Calif, and Mrs. Jo Nell 
Black of Lubbock; two bro­
kers, Billy Reese of Lub­

bock and Bobby Reese of 
Kenvil. N.J.; two grand­
children; five step-grand- 
children; and one great 
grandchild.

West Mains 

Medical Center

Funeral services for 
Grace L. Marberry, 74, of 
Lubbock were held at 10 
a.m. Monday. July 18 in 
Franklin-Bartley Funeral 
Home Chapel with the Rev. 
James Williams, a Baptist 
minister from Snyder, 
officiating.

Graveside services were 
held at 1:30 p.m. Monday 
in Morton Memorial Ceme­
tery in Morton. Burial was 
under the direction of 
Franklin-Bartley Funeral 
Home of Lubbock.

Mrs. Marberry died at 
7:20 a.m. Thursday in St. 
Mary of the Plains Hospital 
following a lengthy illness.

The Yell County, Ark. 
native moved to Lubbock in 
1956, from Bailey County. 
She married William Cecil 
Marberry March 25, 1928, 
in Arlington. He died Feb. 
1, 1955. She was a Baptist.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Myrtle Fizzell of 
Cortez, Colo, and Laura 
Seales of Muleshoe; three 
sons, W.C. “ Bill” ot Lub­
bock Benton of West 
Lynn, Ore and Robert of 
Hamburg, Germany; four 
sisters, Audra Smith of 
Lubbock and Ada Wheeler, 
Flossie Hull and Mary 
Hull, all of Wing, Ark.; 17 
grandchildren; and 16 great 
grandchildren.

V A Basic 
Loan Rate

business.
**•

ADMITTED
July 15-Sallie Schuster
July 16-Roxanne May- 

field
July 17-Ya!onda McFar­

land and Ruby Mills
July 18-Deltor Wenner 

DISMISSED
July 14-John Jouett, So­

nia Cardona, Ansena Fran­
co, David Johnson and 
Amberosio Resina

July 15-Nelcho Rodriq­
uez, Geneva Ramons, 
Manuela Torango and baby 
and Leigh Ann Woods and 
baby girl

July 16-Sallie Schuster, 
Juanita Lumbrera and Lin­
da Lee

July 17-Stcve Reed and 
Misti Prater

July 18-Roxanne May- 
field and baby boy

Best of 
Press

Convinced
Most wives are con­

vinced that their hus­
bands made a better mar­
riage than they did.

-Tribune, Chicago.

hike in one mouth and re­
turned the basic rate to the 
level set last October 13.

At the same time, the 
VA maximum interest rate 
for Graduated Payment 
Mortgage loans was in­
creased to 12.75 percent.

Other current VA loan- 
guarantee rates: 14.5 per­
cent for purchase of manu­
factured home units: 14 
percent to buy both a 
mobile home and a lot; and 
14 percent for loans to 
purchase a lot and the cost 
of necessary site
preparations.

For a veteran buying a 
home with a 30-year, aver­
age GI loan of S55.000, the 
rate increase of a half per­
cent will raise the monthly 
payments by S21 over the 
previous 12 percent rate.

The change, however,, 
doesn’t affect existing Gl 
loans, whose interest rate 
remains the same for the 
life of the agreement.

VA guarantees loans 
made by private lenders to 
eligible veterans, widowed 
spouses of veterans who 
died as a result of service- 
connected disabilities or 
spouses of service person­
nel officially listed as 
missing in action or prison­
ers of war for more than 90 
days.

Unsea.,j -’*Me cold affects 
Soviet harvest.

See Our 

Second Ad 

In This Issue 

For Other 

Red Tag

Specials
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While Supplies t i l l

Econo .iv Lantern 
with B a tte ry !
Rugged polyethylene case has 
a large handle switch located 
up Iron! 6V battery 3I09WBQuantities limited

f r y  & Cox, 
Inc.

• • •
On July 22nd the Maple 

Church of Christ will start 
a three day gospil meeting 
starting at 8 p.m. Nat 
Cooper from Lubbock will 
bring the messages. On 
Sunday afternoon at 3 p.m. 
a singing group, the Mes- 
singers from Lubbock will 
sing. Everyone is invited to 
attend all services.

Friday evening Lulia 
Carlisle and Keith Layton 
were united in marriage at 
the Three Way Baptist 
church in a double ring 
ceremony.

Mr. and Mrs. S.G. Long 
were supper guests Satur­
day evening in the Bill Key 
home in Enochs.

Mrs. Adolph Wittner was 
in Lubbock Tuesday on

William M cGuire, out­
going president of the 
NEA:
..."W e must join and 

lead the debate on educa­
tional excellence.”

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Tyson was in Portales Sat­
urday shopping and at­
tended the senior citizens 
dance.

• • •
The Kindle familys all 

had lunch at the James 
Kindles Sunday.

•«*

The Bill Dupler family, 
the Joe Sowders and Mic­
key Sowder family all at­
tended the annual Sowder 
family reunion at Muleshoe 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Cunnanham and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Gary Free­
man and children from 
Muleshoe spent the week

end with their mother Mrs. 
Naoma Julian.

Jimmy Sides from 
Wheeler spent several days 
visiting his grandparents 
the Jay Boyces.

• • •

Mrs. H.W. Garvin was a 
dinner guest with her 
brother Mr. and Mrs. 
George Tyson.

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Terrell were in Lubbock to

be with her father T.D. 
Davis who is seriously ill.

Mike Sowder from Ft. 
Worth spent the week end 
with his parents the Joe 
Sowders.

$ C A N  W IN
$ 1,000,000

Canadian Governm ent Lottery

OVER
$30,000,000 

IN CASH
Draws Eveiy M onth

One In Four Chance O f 
Winning Cash Phizes 
Up To $1,000,000 

— Many ( IS .  Winners —

Write for info & FREE brochure: 
C.W. AGENCIES 

P.O. Box 7/s>, Station “A”

$ Vancouver, B.C., Canada V6C 2M3 
(604) 683-5861

$

$

P U B L IC  N O T IC E
At the request of the Office of the General Counsel of the Public 
Utility Commission, the Commission has established Docket No. 
5113 to inquire into pressinq issues involving the entire 
telephone industry in Texas. Docket No. 5113 will deal with many 
issues resulting from the impending divestiture of American 
Telephone and Telegraph Company and Southwestern Bell 
Telephone Company. Some of those issues include establishing 
the service areas of Southwestern Bell after divestiture and 
assessing the impact on other telephone companies in Texas, in­
cluding General Telephone Of The Southwest, of current settle­
ment arrangements between Southwestern Bell and those com­
panies. Additionally, Docket No 5113 will deal with the issues 
arising from the Federal Communications Commission's Final 
Order in Docket 78-72 (the Access Charge Docket) as they impact 
all telephone companies, including General Telephone Company 
Of The Southwest. It is anticipated that Docket No. 5113 will be 
evidentiary in nature. RATES FOR GENERAL TELEPHONE COM ­
PANY OF THE SOUTHWEST MAY BE DETERMINED BY THE 
COMMISSION IN OR AS A RESULT OF THIS PROCEEDING. In­
terested parties seeking further information or desiring to par­
ticipate in Docket No. 5113 are advised to write to Rhonda Col­
bert Ryan, Secretary and Director of Hearings, Public Utility Com­
mission of Texas, 7800 Shoal Creek Boulevard, Suite 400N, 
Austin, Texas 78757 or telephone the Public Utility Commission 
Consumer Affairs Division at (512)458-0223 or 458-0227, or (512) 
458-0221 TTY for the deaf.

General Telephone
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Increased •*w
The Veterans Admini- •

stration increased the basic •
loan-guarantee rate for .
single-family homes and g
condominiums by a half
percent July 11 to 12.5 •
percent, said W.E. Wei-
sT?hd, loan Guaranty o f :
ficer for the Waco 
Regional Office.

VA j

ATTEND THE CHURCH 

OF YOUR CHOICE

i

I

EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Emmaneul
107 East Third
Isaias Cardenas. Pastor
RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST CHURCH
17th and West Ave. D
Brock Sanders, Pastor
SPANISH BAPI 1ST MISSION
East Third and Ave. E
Roy Martinez, Pastor-* V
TRINITY BAPTIST*CHURCH
314 Ave. B
Don Knight, Pastor
LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH
Phone 946-3413
B.C. Stonecipher, Pastor
161H AND AVE. D CHURCH OF CHRIST
James Johnson, Minister
Sunday - 10:30 a.m.
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Donald G. Proctor, Pastor 
Progress, Texas
NORTH SIDE CHURCH OF CHRIST
117 E. Birch Street
SPANISH ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F
Luis Campos, Pastor
UNITED PENTECOSTAL GOSPEL
Lig h t h o u s e  c h u r c h
207 E. Ave G.
George Green, Pastor
MULESHdE BAPTIST CHURCH
8th and Ave. G
Bob Dodd, Pastor
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave. E
J.E. Meeks, Pastor
TEMPLO CAL VAR 10
507 S. Main
Sunday • 10:00 a.m.
Sunday evening - 7:00 p.m.
Evangelistic Services 
J.L. Soto, Pastor

TEMPLO CAlV/.RIO  
507 S. Main 
Sunday • 10:00 a.m.
Sunday evening - 7:00 p.m.
Evangelistic Services 
J.L. Soto, Pastor

T H E  L I G H T
"TIiW cw d  is a lump unto my tael, amt a light unto my path.'

lhe  biblc. God’s word, has often been compared to a light, for it penefates the 

darkness and reveals God to man tj is the light that bads nan  down life - 

‘pathway Tor those who study it. it repeals not only the past, but «.!so the future

"The entrance of thit mords ijiueth light; it rjiuelh.understanding.

Attend church and hear God's leaders expound on His word

The Church is God s oppo.nted ogency in 
this world lor spreoding the knowledge ol 
His love for man ond of His demand for 
man to respond fo that love by loving his 
neighbor Without this grounding in the 
love of God, no government or society or 
way of life will long persevere nnd the 
freedoms which we hold so dear will in­
evitably perish. Therefore, even from a 
selfish point of view, one should suppoit 
the Church lor the soke of the welfare of 
himself ond his family. Beyond that, how 
ever, every person should uphold and 
participate in the Church because it tells 
the truth obouf man's life, death and 
destiny; the truth which clone will s-:l him

> . ■ > M i HI f l f f i l K W i  H I  Iree to live as o child of God

C o le m a n  A d *  S e n

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
1J0 W. Ave. G 
Dick Tarr, Pastor 
Sunday School - 10:00 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.
LATIN AMERICAN METHODIST MISSION
5th and Ave. D
R.Q. Chavez, Pastor
THE COMMUNITY CHURCH
Morton Highway
H.D. Hunter, Pastor
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
1733 W. Ave. C

PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST CHURCH
1st and 3rd Sundays
Clifford Slay, Pastor
FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
507 W. 2nd. Muleshoe
Bill Kent, Pastor
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN
Lariat, Texas
Sunday School • 10:00 a m.
Worship Service • 11:00 a.m.
Herman J. Schelter, Pastor
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 S. First
Elder Bernard Gowens
MUIESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST
Clovis Highway
John A. Boor, Minister
JEHOVAH WITNESS
Friona Highway
Boyd Lowery, Pastor
IMMACULATE CONCEPTION CATHOLIC
Father Patrick Maher
Northeast of City in Morrison Edition
ST. MATTHEW BAPTIST CHURCH
Corner of West Boston and W. Birch
M.S. Brown, Pastor
NEW COVENANT CHURCH
Plainview Highway
Sunday - 10:00 a.m.
Wednesday - 7:00 p.m.
Jimmy Low, Pastor

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
521 South First 
Lee R. Rich, Pastor

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
9th and Ave. C 
Jimmie Williams, Pastor

| Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B 272-4288

Western Drug

272-3106

Muleshoe 
jj Publishing Co.

Ik0 a in f
Queen

Margie Hawkins 

Manager
2723412

James Roy Meat 
Market Co.

■~>I8) U , A r m - r .  H Im I .  2 7 2 - 1 :1 6 1

First National 
Bank

“Home Owned'*—
202 S. 1st 272-4515

Five Area Telephone 
Cooperative Inc.

272-5533_______

Farmers Spraying 
Service

Irrigation Pumps 
& Power

Baker Farm 
Supply Inc.

American Valley 
Inc.

Muleshoe 
Co-op Gins

Wl .S'. l»L
272 151!

Lambert Cleaners
Steam Carpet Cleaning, 

Drapery Cleaning*
123 Main 272-461:6 J

Farmers d'o - Op \ 
Elevators 1 i

3 Loealions to Serve You 
272 - 4335272-4260
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Get A Free Two Liter Bottle Of Coke When You Buy 
10 Gallons Or More Of Gas At Fina.

i At The Crossroads
Corner Of Hwy. 84 & 214.

NEW 

ARRIVALS:

u i u n i u i  u juuui. » j

McKina Leigh Woods
Mr. and Mrs. Michael 

Woods of Farwell are the 
proud parents of a daugh­
ter born at 4:33 p.m. July 
11 in West Plains Medical 
Center.

The young lady weighed 
six pounds seven ounces 
and has been named 
McKinzi Leigh. She has a 
sister, Chelsi, two and a 
half years of age.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Kirkland 
and Carliss and Irene 
Woods, all of Farwell.

Great grandparents are 
Willie and Elsie Hardage of 
Farwell, Bea Green of

Kimberly Kenette Doty
Mr. and Mrs. Craig Doty 

are the proud parents of a

mm, kl

daughter born at 3:56 a.m. 
July 8 in South Plains 
Hospital in Amherst.

The young lady weighed 
seven pounds four ounces 
and was 10 and a half 
inches long. She has been 
named Kimberly Renette.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard Thomp­
son of M unday and Mr. 
and Mrs. J.C. Doty of 
Sudan.

Great grandparents in­
clude: Mrs. Evah Doty and 
Mrs. Verdie Gann, both of 
Sudan ar.d Mr. and Mrs. 
Inez Hurst of Aspermont.

Karissa Lorene Foster
Mr. and Mrs. Ken Foster 

of Farwell are the proud 
parents of a daughter born 
at 12:37 p.m. July 12 in 
West Plains Medical 
Center.

The young lady weighed 
seven pounds two and half 
ounces and has been nam­
ed Karissa Lorene. She is 
the first child for the 
couple.

Grandparents are Wayne 
and Louise Foster of Far- 
well and Jack and Lat'elle 
Hysinger of Muleshoe.
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Great grandparents are 
Freddie Mae Hysinger of 
Olton and R.A. and Lorene 
Jeffreys of Hale Center.

Great great grandmother 
is Minnie Stewart of Hale 
Center.

Journal Files
of the week at the Mule­
shoe State Bank. He and 
Mrs. Throckmorton have 
three daughters, Vowary, 
Danita and Belinda. They 
are farmers and attend the 
Northside Church of Christ.

UCretia Deann Roberts 50 Years Ago 30 Years Ago 20 Years Ago
Mr. and Mrs. Daryl Ro­

berts of Stephenville are 
the proud parents of a 
daughter born June 26 in 
Stephenville.

She weighed sever, 
pounds 12 ounces and was 
20 inches long. She has 
been named LaCretia De­
ann. The little lady has a 
17 month old sister, 
Crystal.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Ben Bolling of 
Stephenville and Mr. and 
Mrs. A.J. Roberts of 
Sudan.

Great grandmother is 
Ora Roberts of Muleshoe. 
She also has a great 
grandfather in Stephenville.

Stefanie Elaine Perrymin
Mr. and Mrs. James R. 

Perryman of Lexington, 
N.C. are the proud parents 
of a daughter, Stefanie 
Elaine, bom July 6 at 
Community General Hos­
pital in Thomasville, N.C.

The young lady weighed 
nine pounds antfr two and 
a half ounces. She has a 
brother, Darren four and a 
half years of age.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs James A. Robert­
son of Muleshoe and Mr. 
and Mrs. George Riden- 
hour of Lexington, N.C.

Great grandparents are 
Janie Stancell of Muleshoe, 
Emma Robertson of Little­
field and Mary Lee Perry­
man of Lexingtou, N.C.

Stefanie’s mother >s the 
former Laurene Robertson.

RECIPE
eBy Sarah Anne Sherdan

2
■>

m
2
3
3

Spoon Bread
c meal
c boiling water 
c milk 
t salt
T butter or margarine 
large eggs

SCHOLARSHIP RECEIVED..... Sandra Hughes, graduate of
MHS and 1982 gradua.e of Vernon Regional Junior College 
has been awarded a Robert G. Car.' afnd Nona K. Can- 
Academic Scholarship1 in the amount of SI,000 to Angelo 
State University in recognition of her academic and per­
sonal achievements. She will major in elementary education 
and plans to become a teacher of exceptional children. 
Sandi ii is the daughter of Lee Roy and Janie Hughes of 
Muleshoe.

Sift meai twice and stir in 
boiling water. Add butter 
and salt. Add milk and beat­
en egg yolks. Fold in stiffly 
beaten egg whites. Place in a 
buttered baking dish and 
bake 30 to 40 minutes in an 
oven 325 degrees.

Buy a new or used combine 
now„.pay no finance charges 
until May 1, '84

If you're looking for a new  John Deere 
combine or a dependable used combine, stop 
in and see us. Here's the deal: Purchase that 
combine from us and. if you rinanc* it witn 
John Deere, you 'll have no finance charges 
come due until M ay 1, 1984 *

In addition, it could be to your advantage 
to buy this year so you  can earn tax savings

from kivestment Tax Credit |ITC) and 
depreciation It's something to consider 

Consider leasng a new  combine, too, with 
discounted lease paym ent comparable in 
value to waiver of finance charge 

Simply, w e re m aking the best value an 
even better value. Stop n  and see us today 
for details.**

‘ AvafcMfy c# Join Derrr Srwrxng ai)|rct (o approval ot aw*
**Dealf( cnrtnCuocn m ffr u«u pqum rt cjh i rrviy ,wa cusott* pne

Dent - Rempe, Inc.
1516 W. Amer. 272-4296

________

1933
A petition containing 147 

names was circulated in 
Muleshoe last Thursday 
and the following day sent 
to the State Highway 
Commission. It was one of 
a number of similar peti­
tions asking that immediate 
consideration be given by 
the commission toward fin­
ishing the paving of U.S. 
Highway No. 70 from 
Vernon to the West Texas 
state line at Farwell.

1953
Mr. and Mrs. J.V. Peeler 

visited relatives in Little­
field Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. W. M. 
Pool, Jr. are in New 
Mexico this week on a 
fishing trip.

10 Years Ago
1963

Lloyd D. Throckmorton 
has been named customer

1973
In the meet market of a 

local grocery store the foll­
owing items were on sale 
this week: rib steak $1.19 a 
pound; rib roast $1.19 a 
pound.

1 ®BUKK

tMNTWC B

ROBERT D. GREEN, INC.

MUUSHOL TfXAl JTM1

OLDSMOSIti -  XIKX -  PONTIAC -  3MC

TERRY YELL
Sales Representative

Business Phone 
806 272-4588 
505 752-2772

Hgmo Phone 
806 272-4948

TWIRLING CLINIC...A beginners Twirling Ginic was held 
on Friday, July 15 at the American Legion Hall under the 
instruction of Debbie Goud, Sue Bessire and Sherri 
Bcssire. The following girls all received medals of merit for 
participation in the clinic, LaTavia Copley, Mindy Tucker, 
Audra Lee, Cheree Copley, Myra Jones, Kim Griswold, 
Amy Flanary, Kimberly Anzaldua and Drissi Perez. Winn­
ing the Spirit Trophy was LaTavia Copley.

a i U M M i f f  .................................. ..i > u i A t k i m itm u m m A J t J U J j L i u j a l m i a » AJA U U U j

Ince Oil Co, No, 21

Our Good Fina Gas Cigarettes
Reg, *1.149 85c a pack

Unleaded *1.19’ *825 a carton

Your One Stop Service For Gas, Oil, & Snacks
Milk, Bread, Pops, Herby Sandwiches, &

Tom s Assorted Candies
We Also Have Fine Fina Oil And Other Major Oils.

Open Monday-Saturday: 6 a.m.-11 p.m. M k '9  

Sunday: 8 a.m.-10 p.m.

R.C. Day, Manager

272-3426
Bui m ju A U J U iu AJU .u . M i m u i .u j LM » i i  i m  k M iA t u u u m t J U U u t u i J U J U u u . u k m m m m t u n t i  m j .u a
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LINDA SHAFER

Ernest Ramm’s Host 
Bauer Family Reunion

July 2, 3 and 4th. child­
ren, grandchildren and 
great grandchildren of Mrs,

Sudan Senior 
Citizens 
Meeting Held

The Sudan Area Senior 
Citizens gathered at 7:30 
p.m. Tuesday at the Sudan 
Community Center for a 
called special meeting for 
the purpose of discussing a 
proposal to purchase a 
building.

Committee members, 
Paul Chisholm, Cleo Whit­
mire and Raymond Gage 
reported on their meeting 
with the First National 
Bank president, Tom Rigs 
by, who presented the 
bank’s proposal for the sale 
of the Gamble building. 
The preliminary proposal 
was for the price of 
$22,500.00 with a down 
payment of $7,500.00 leav­
ing a balance of $15,000 to 
be paid on or before ten 
years which would be ap­
proximately $220.00 per 
month.

Fne motion was made 
this proposal be accepted 
and the group entered into 
a sales agreement with the 
bank to purchase the 
building.

Following a lengthy dis­
cussion interupted with a 
recess during which time 
several crossed the street 
to—look at the building, 
the motion was brought to 
a vote and carried affirma­
tively 61-2.

Before the members de 
parted for the evening, 
those present paid or 
pledged approximately 
$4200 toward the down 
payment on the building 
Since that time has been 
good response throughout 
the community aided by 
numerous friends of the 
club and there is enthus­
iasm that the project will 
be highly successful.

Plans are being made for 
the next meeting of the 
Senior Citizens group to be 
held in the Gamble build­
ing Monday, Aug. 1 at 7 
p.m.

m M ¥
O l f T "

LOSE UP TO 10 LBS. 

IN 15 DAYS

THE MOST EFECTIVE 

DIET FOR TODAY 'S 
:AST - PACED LIFESTYLE

•  DELICIOUS 

•  SAFE • S IM P LE

•  EFFECTIVE

LOOK AN D  FEEL 
GREAT

CALL

9 2 5 -6 6 4 4
preferably  m o r n in g s

WEEKDAYS

ELLEN GLOVER
DISTRIBUTOR *

Edna Bauer held their first 
family reunion at the 
country home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ernest Ramm.

Mrs. Ramm said “ the 
back yard looked like an 
indian village with tents, 
campers and cots set up for 
a little sleeping.

Children present includ­
ed: Mr. and Mrs. Harry 
Walker of Las Vegas, Nev.; 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Roy 
Bauer of Monette, Miss.; 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest 
Ramm of Muleshoe; and 
Mr. ard  Mrs. Don Blalack 
of Wichita, Kansas. One 
son, Franklin Baue: of Bois 
D’Arc, Miss, was unable to 
attend.

Grandchildren and great 
grandchildren attending 
were: Mrs. Donna Key and 
leroy and a friend, Jim 
Claytor of Tecumseh, 
Okla.; Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Quigley, Jeremiah and 
Nathan, Mrs. Edith Speak- 
man and Richie of Las 
Vegas, Nev.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Will Stalcup, Janay and L. 
C. of Tyler; Mrs. Doug 
Fuller and Leslie of Boli­
var, Miss.; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ricky Lee Bauer and Gus- 
tin of Verona, Miss.

Also Mrs. Colin Young 
and Cody of Wilkerson, 
Indiana; Miss Leah Bauer 
and fiance Robert Hile of 
Monette, Miss.; Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Owen and Kyle 
of Muleshoe; Miss Alta 
Ramm of Plainview; Mrs. 
Lindel Davis of Victoria; 
Mr. and Mrs. Clayton 
Ramm and Drew of Mule­
shoe and Bryan and Susan 
Blalack of Wichita, Kansas.

It was reported that the 
42 family members enjoyed 
attending church, eating, 
playing games, taking pic­
tures, watching old movies 
of yesteryears when the 
family members were much 
younger and plenty of vis­
iting. Only 14 family mem­
bers were enable to attend.

c&kLdaC Sfcowei ccJetes
(jUiss SMa Sliaje/t

Miss Linda Shafer was Allen Jones, Mrs. Robert
feted with a bridal shower 
Saturday, July 16 from 10 
until 11:30 a.m. in the 
home of Mrs. Frank Ellis.

Guests were greeted by 
Mrs. Lewis W. Shafer, 
Mrs. Jimmie Rhoads, Mrs. 
Frank Ellis and the honoree 
and registered by Traci 
Zoth.

Mrs. Bruce Shafer and 
Mrs. Curtis Walker served 
coffee cake, fruit from a 
pineapple boat, apricot 
punch and coffee from 
brass and crystal 
appointments.

The serving table was 
covered with an ecru table 
runner and accented with 
an arrangement of yellow 
daisey mums. The honor­
ee’s corsage was made of 
yellow daisies.

Special guests included: 
Mrs. Olin Whitmire, 
grandmother of the bride; 
Mrs. Lewis Shafer, grand­
mother of the bride; Mrs. 
Bruce Shafer, Mrs. Curtis 
Walker, Mrs. Traci Zoth 
and Mrs. A.J. Shafer.

The hostesses gift was a 
Sunbeam stainless steel 
mixer. Hostesses for the 
occasion included: Mrs. 
J.L. Dale, Mrs. Norman 
Head, Mrs. Pat Nichols, 
Mrs. J.W. Herrington, 
Mrs. Joe Rhodes, Mrs.

Hooten, Mrs. J.L. Dunbar, 
Mrs. M.G. Killough. Mrs. 
Leland Jones, Mrs. J.R. 
Carter, Mrs. John Gunter, 
Jr. and Mrs. Frank Ellis.

AARP
News

Out To Lunch
H i i m l i

Weekly luncheon for 
“Out to Lunch Bunch” was 

held at Summit Savings. A 
short business meeting was 
held during the luncheon.

Pi-ns were made to have 
a skating party for all the 
members and their families 
plus a discussion on open­
ing up the skating party to 
the Muleshoe community. 
Mary Ann Ramirez was 
appointed chairperson and 
will report back regarding 
the final plans and dates.

Donna Noriega made 
“ Goodie Jars” and the 
group adopted to add these 
to the “ Welcome pack” for 
all new families coming 
into the Muleshoe area, on 
their home visits.

Kay Moncrief, Kathy 
Railsback and Donna Nor­
iega visited with the Jen- 
nyslippers on Tuesday July 
12 at the Mule Putt Putt.

Pat Mudford is organiz­
ing a class for those inter­
ested in learning the basics 
of Cake Decorating. Those 
interested should contact 
her at 272-3305.

A salad luncheon is 
planned for our next meet­
ing on July 22.

Those attending the 
luncheon were: Mary Ann 
Ramirez and David, Dolor­
es Scott, April, Aimee, 
Paul and Bruce; Deanna 
Rasco, Bryan and Jason; 
Kay Moncrief, Glenda 
Duncan, Ruthie Davis and 
Jason, and Donna Noriega.

For further information 
please call Kay Moncrief 
272-5480 or Dolores Scott 
272-3204

The State Legislative 
Committee Chairman of the 
largest organization of old­
er persons in Texas today 
praised Texas lawmakers 
for rejecting legislation in 
the 68th session which 
would have weakened the 
Texas Homestead Act Lt. 
Col. Nora Grav Springfield 
(Ret.), chairman of the 
State Legislative Committee 
of the American Associa­
tion of Retired Persons 
said, “ Older citizen’s prop­
erty is well protected by 
the constitution and there 
is no need to alter the con­
stitution to allow liens 
against home equity.”

Col. Springfield, whose 
organization represents 
more than 610,000 mem­
bers before the legislative 
and executive branches of 
state government said, 
“ Efforts to weaken the 
Homestead Amendment are 
coming from consumer fi- 
rance groups and lenders 
who see tapping home 
equity as a large money 
maker. Fortunately there is 
no clamor fr^m the people 
of Texas to change the 
Homestead Act.”

Col. Springfield stated 
that one of the most im­
portant pieces of legislation 

taffecting older persons was 
the establishment of a 
Health & Human Services 
Coordinating Council with 
authority to study health 
issues and health care costs 
and the establishment of a 
Long Term Care Coordin­
ating Courril for the 
Elderly.

Although disappointed 
major nursing home reform 
legislation d*d not pass. 
Col. Springfield com­
mended lawmakers for 
passing several bills to al­
low the state to better pro­
tect the some 8G.00C res­
idents who resioe in the 
state’s 1,000 nursing 
homes; and for providing 
additional money over the 
next two years for com­
munity care programs for 
the state’s elderly to assist 
those who do not need to 
be placed in nursing 
homes.

On chunges in the state's 
public utility laws, she 
said, “ Residential con­
sumers were given a boost 
with the enactment of leg­
islation to require a public 
intervenor to represent res­
idential rate payers before 
the Public Utility 
Commission.”

Sligh tly over 46 percent of 
the land in Am erica is 
given over to agriculture.

Best Hotel Location in Town

Next to New Orleans' 
Famous French Quarter

We're on world famous Canal Street in 
the central business district overlooking 
the mighty Mississippi River, opposite 
the Convention Center and next lo 
the exciting historic French Quarter 
with its sidewalk artists, famous res­
taurants, antique shops, naughty 
Bourbon Street and all that jazz.
Just minutes from Louisiana's unrivalled 
Superdome and 20 minutes from Inter 
na,:onal Airport via Interstate 1-10.
Excellent accommodations and service 
at reasonable prices await you at the 
first class International hotel...375 
handsomely appointed rooms and 
suites, color TV, fingertip climate 
control, gieat 'esfaurants and lounges, 
pool, valet parking, airport transpor 
tation ...everything!
The International Hotel is “the place” 
to stay in romantic New Orleans... 
one of the world's most unique cities 
... debonair, pleasure-loving, with a live 
and let-live philosophy. New Orleans

hasn't forgotten her European heritage, 
nor has she abandoned the flavor of 
th: Old South.
You'll love New Orleans and she'll low. 
you right back.

F A M I L Y
P L A Y

(UP TO 4)

m n

. H Y I I S S I I ' T I SSu lijt;i'l t o  A v i i l l a l i l l l l y

INTERNATIONAL HOTEL©
300 Canul Street, New Orleans, Louisiana 70140

For Reservations Cali Toll Free. Louisiana, 800-662-1930 
United Slltes, 800-535-7783

___

Creative Woman
By Sheryl Borden

CARIBBEAN PLAYGROUND...Elizabeth Wood and Geor­
gia Lowe of Muleshoe are pictured on the deck of Carnival 
Cruise Line’s “ fun ship” , TSS Festivale, just before sailing 
out of the port of Miami, under sunny Florida skies, on a 
seven day cruise to the Caribbean Playground. During the 
voyage, the 35,000 ton flagship will make calls at: Nassau,
Bahamas; San Juan, Puerto Rico and St. Thomas, U.S.
Virgin Islands. (Photo courtesy of Carnival Cruise Line.) M l i r y  M a r t h a

On July 19 and 23, Mary 
Johnson from Portales will 
continue her discussion 
concerning dried arrange­
ments made from plants, 
grasses, leaves and even 
weeds. Mary will show 
viewers how to make their 
own homemade drying 
formula that works as well 
and is much less expensive 
than the commercial drying 
compounds. She will also 
display several different 
dried arrangements.

Nina Swan Director of 
Consumer Relations with 
the National Oats Company 
from Cedar Rapids, Iowa 
will talk to us about using 
different toppings for oat­
meal and will prepare some 
recipes using oats in a 
slightly different way. 
These two topics will be 
aired on Tuesday at 12:30 
p.m. and also on Saturday

Sudan Heritage 
Committee 
Meeting Held
By Evelyn Ritchie

A called meeting of the 
Sudan Heritage Committee 
was held Monday, July 11 
at the Community Center.

Members of this organi­
zation wish to express theii 
appreciation of the support 
given to the roof project to 
the hotel building. To date 
the fund has $2,454.30 for 
this project and more is 
needed. If more should be 
received it will be used for 
other hotel improvements.

Annual dues are now due 
and will be appreciated. 
They are $5.00 annually.

Approximately 90 member­
ships were paid during the 
July celebration.

It was decided to hold 
the monthly meeting in the 
hotel for the remainder of 
the warm montns beginn­
ing with the second Mon­
day in September at 5 p.m. 
Make a note of this date 
and try to atttnd.

Present for this meeting 
were: Mary Tollett, Doro­
thy Drake, Eloese Curry, 
Doretha Jones, Sara Wood 
and A1 Harrison.

The Lincoln Penny was 
first issued by the Phila­
delphia mint in 1909. It 
re^aced the Indian-head 
penny which had been in 
circulation for 50 years.

Sunday School 
Class Meets

Members of the Mary 
Martha Sunday School 
Class of the Sudan First 
Baptist Church were treat­
ed to a special luncheon at 
the home of their teacher, 
Mrs. Esther Meeks, 
recently.

Mrs. Meek’s daughters, 
Ann Arnold of San Antonio 
and Jane Campbell of 
Littlefield prepared and 
served the meal.

Class members attending 
were Mrs. Annie Chester, 
Mrs. Viola Gore, Mrs. Mae 
Baker, Mrs. Daisey Ford. 
Mrs. Pearl Wright, Mrs. 
Mary Markham. Mrs.. Faye 
Dorsey and Mrs. Luella 
Kendricks and tne hostess.

at 2:00 p.m. on Channel 3.
The topics to be pre­

sented on “ The Creative 
Woman” show on July 21 
include low sodium inform­
ation, ways to creat fast 
fashion and recipes for low 
calorie Italian cookery. The 
show will air on Thursday 
at 12:30 p.m. on 
KENW-TV.

Hazel Wallace, Consumer 
Affairs Officer and Dr. 
Frank Newman, Regioinal 

.Medical Officer with the 
Food and Drug Admin­
istration in Dallas, Texas 
will be guests on the show 
and will discuss the effects 
of sodium intake in the 
diet. This program will be 
the first in a three-part 
series entitled “ Sodium- 
Think About It” .

With today’s busy life­
styles, all homemakers are 
looking for methods for 
creating fast fashion. One 
shortcut is precut inter­
facing called Pellon Fuse ’n 
Fold and to demonstrate 
uses for this product will 
be Ann Meyer, Education 
Representative with the 
Pellon Corporation in New 
York.

Evelyn Davis, Extension 
Home Economist in Tuc- 
umcari, will be another 
guest on the show and will 
demonstrate ways to make 
Italian cookery lower in 
calories but retain the ex­
cellent taste.

“ The Creative Woman” 
is produced and hosted by 
Sheryl Borden. The show is 
also carried by KRWG-TV 
in Las Cruces and by 
KNME-TV in Albuquer­
que. Viewers can request 
copies of printed materials 
offered on the show by 
calling on the toll-free tele­
phone lires at KENW.

If A ir Conditioning 
doesn't have it  

it  probably doesn't have it.
Gas Air Conditioning Has It!
No other air conditioner has a warranty 
like a gas air conditioner because no 
other air conditioner is built like a gas 
air conditioner.

Gas air conditioning has fewer moving 
parts and no compressor to wear out 
or break down. This means less wear 
and tear and lower maintenance costs.

That’s why gas air conditioning is so 
dependable and why it has a warranty 
that's twice as long as other types of 
units ... a full 10 years!

Find out more about the air 
conditioning that’s backed by the best 
warranty available. Call Energas today 
for a free cooling survey and cost 
estimate. There’s no obligation.

Remember, all air conditioning 
was not created equal. And we 
have the paper to prove it!

Manufacturer's limited warranty covers all detects In materials and 
workmanship on the sealed refrigeration unit lor ten years from the 
date ot Installation of the air conditioner when It la Installed In a 
s in g *  family residence All other parts are warranted for one year
from date of installation

ENERGQS
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Eight Local Gymnasts Attend Plainview Meet

GYMNASTIC MEET PARTICIPANTS...Eight gymnasts from Hawkins and Purdy School of 
Dance and Gvmnastics attended a class 3 and 4 gymnastics meet in Plainview recently.

^  Standing (L-R-) D’Anne Box and Holley Morris; Front row; Renee Martin, Erin Kelley, 
^  Brenna Matthews, Michelle Rinney and Christy Cook. Not Pictured; Angie King.

Reception Honors1968GraduatingClass
Members of the ;lass of 

1968 of the Sudan schools 
held a reception Saturday, 
July 2 at the compress jff-

Library News
By Ann Camp

I would tike to thank 
everyone who helped to 
make our 1983 Summer 
Reading Club program the 
success it was...The news 
Meida, Bailey County 
Journal, Channel 6, and 
KMUL radio for the 
excellent publicity; The 
Friends of the Library for 
their support in furnishing 
materials, prizes and 
treats; All who brought 
items for our Western dis­
plays, Especially Sheriff 
and Mrs. Bob Henderson, 
and Kristin Chitwood; and 
for the good programs as 
well as display materi­
al..Debbie Brooks; Kristi 

.Spies; Lynn Moore; Ben 
Harmon and Lonnie Adri- 

. an
The boys i.nd girls who 

couldn’t attend 'he awards 
day may pick up their 
awards anytime; also the 
brands the kius made may 
be picked up, if they want 
them. Especially, we need 
to get all books that were 
checked out during the 
Reading Club, Please bring 
them back to the Library., 
don’t make us have to send 
out over-due notices on 
them.

Izetta Shain did a lot of 
volunteer work getting our 
big box of Money-saving 
coupons brought up to 
date, pulling all the expired 
coupons out of the box, so 
as many now do, the public 
is welcome to come and 
browse thru the coupons 
and save on groceries. 
Most stores welcome the 
use of coupons these days, 
and I’m told a lot can be 
saved

ices following the Lions 
Club Bar-B-Que.

The table was covered 
with a white cloth and the 
centerpiece featured gold 
and red (class colors) 
mums with a banner read­
ing “ Class of 1968” .

Punch and hors d’houvr- 
es were served. The table 
held displays of the an­
nuals and other items of 
interest of the earlier days 
of the classmates.

Members of the class at­
tending included Donna 
Gaston Green of Muleshoe; 
Sharron Baker Wood of 
Midland; Judy West Kelley 
of Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. 
Robin Davis (Nancy Lance) 
of Facksboro; Andrea Tho- 
masson Yarbrough of Mid­
land; Gary Gatewood, Van 
Seymore and Linda Wood 
Williams, all of Sudan and 
Sidny Chance of Lubbock.

Others attending includ­
ed: Corky Green of Mule­
shoe, Gary Kelley of Lub­
bock, Ronnie Mooney of 
Canyon, Mike Bellar of 
Jacksonville, Tommy Taylor 
of Olympia, Washington; 
B.A. Narramcre of Dun- 
cam'lie and Mr. and Mrs. 
Damon Provence, Kathy 
Gatewood, Velma Seymore 
and Dwight Williams, all of 
Sudan.

On Sunday afternoon the 
group met for home made- 
ice cream in the back yard 
of Mr. and Mrs. Pete 
Lance. This event included 
a get together for class 
members and their 
families.

Attending were Mr. and 
Mrs. Corky Green and 
Rhett of Muleshoe, Sharron 
Wood and Crystal of Mik- 
land. Mr. and Mrs. Gary 
Gatewood, Jamie and Grant 
of Sudan, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Mooney and Travis 
of Canyon, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Kemley, Erik, Mich­
ael and Jeffrey of Lubbock, 
Andrea Yarbrough of Mid­
land, Mr. and Mrs. Sid 
Chance and Casy of Lub­
bock, Mr. and Mrs. Marvin

Tollett and Kenneth Noles, 
Mr. and Mrs. Robin Davis, 
Mandy and Muffin and Mr. 
and Mrs. Pete Lance.

Employer’s 
Tax Deadline
Near

Aug. 1 is the date by 
which employers must re- 
oort on Form 941 social 
security and withheld fed­
eral income taxes for the 
second quarter of 1983 and 
pay any taxes due, the In­
ternal Revenue Service 
says. If the quarterly lia­
bility (less any deposit dur­
ing the quarter) is $500 or 
more, the unpaid balance 
must be deposited.

This deadline does not 
apply to employers who 
make timely deposits of the 
full amount of tax due in 
Federal Reserve or ap­
proved commercial banks. 
They are allowed until 
Aug. 10 to file Form 941, 
"Employer’s Quarterly 
Federal fax  Return,’’

Employers who have not 
received a Form 941 by 
mail can order one through 
the Forms/Tax Information 
number listed in the tele­
phone book under U.S. 
Government. IRS Publica­
tion 15, Circular
E-Employer’s Tax Guide, 
is also available by 
telephone.
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Eight gymnasts from 
Hawkins and Purdy School 
of Dance and Gymnastics 
competed in a Class 3 and
4 meet in Plainview Sat­
urday, July 9th. They com­
peted in three age divisions 
(1) eight years and under
in which Renee Martin and 
Christy Cook competed; (2) 
nine to 11 year class 4 in
which Holley Morris, Erin 
Kelley, Angie King and 
D’Anne Box competed; (3) 
In the last group were 
Brenna Matthews andONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ
1. Who won the men’s 
singles at Wimbledon.
2. Who won the women’s 
singles at Wimbledon?
3. Who won the Western 
Open Golf Tournament?
4. Who won the LPGA Peter 
Jackson Classic?
5. Name the player who 
pitched the first no-hitter of 
the season.Answers To Sports Quii
1. John McEnroe over Chris 
Lewij.
2. Martina Navratilova over 
Andrea Jeager.
3. Mark McCumber.
4. Hollis Stacy.
5. Dave Righetti of New 
York Yankees.

Michelle Finney. They were 
in the nine to 11 year old 
class 3 division.

Renee brought home a 
till’d place on the vault, 
uneven bars and the all 
around. She received two 
blue ribbons on the beam 
and floor exercise. This

Region One 
Princess Rides 
In Sudan Parade

Tracey McPherson, 16 
year old daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. J.L. Garrett of 
Seminole, Region one Prin­
cess of the AASP and RC 
Riding Clubs was among 
the riders in Sudan’s July 
Celebration Parade held 
July 2.

She is competing at var­
ious functions with three 
girls and hopes to be 
crowned Queen of the 
Association.

She will be judged on 
personality, appearance, 
horsemanship and know­
ledge of the AASP and RC. 
She is a member of the 
Wagon Wheel Saddle Club 
of Seagraves and is a jun­
ior in high school where 
she is active in tennis, 4-H 
and FFA.

was her first gymnastic 
meet.

Christy received a third 
place on the floor exercise, 
and second place on the 
vault, uneven bars, beam 
and the all around. This 
was one of Christy’s first 
gymnastic meets.

Holley Morris won her 
age group and division by 
bringing home the blue in 
every even*

Erin Kelley placed third 
on the vault, uneven bars

and the beam. She received 
a second place on the floor 
exercise and the all around.

Angie King placed third 
on the floor exercise and 
the all around. She came 
home with a second on the 
vault, uneven bars and the 
beam.

D’Anne Box placed fifth 
ion the vault, uneven bars 
and the all around. She 
received a fourth on the 
floor exercise and second 
on the beam.

In the class three divi­
sion, Michelle Finney plac­
ed third on the vault and 
the balance beam. She re­
ceived a second place on 
the uneven bars, floor ex­
ercise, and the all around.

Brenna Matthews also 
won her division by placing 
first in every event and 
bringing home the blue.

Coaches Bob Cowley and 
Ricki Kelley accompanied 
the gymnasts to Plainview. 
Fans also attending were 
Danny and Evan Kelley, 
the Martin family and Sheri 
Hawkins.

Summit Savings Money Market Rates

304 Main Muleshoe 272-5527
6 Months 

Money 
M arket 

Certificate

Money

Fund
1

Super
Now

Checking

9 .45% 8.75% 6 .75%
Rates Subject To Change Ever/ Tuesday.

Great Values for

Back to School!

Save 35%

sale 12.88
Men’s Short Sleeve Knit Shirts
Reg. $18-$20. Munsingwear poly-cotton sport shirts 
have placket collars and year 'round styling. Choose 
from assorted solids and siripes in men's sizes SML.XL.

sale *io88
Mens Fashion Jeans
•  Texas Tuff

•  Great Fashionable Styling

Matching Calico Fabrics

|3 yds.

Quilting
Prints, reg. 1.79 yd. Quilting, reg. 2.99 yd
Matching "Apple Cider" calico prints anc 
single face quilting have rustic charm witt 
the easy care of 50% Celanese Fortrel " 
polyester and 50% cotton. These assortec 
Fali prints are 45" wide rolled on bolts 
They'll add chaim to fashions and home

*18«>*20
Junior ATB Denim Jeans
Our own brand of snazzy denim jeans at 
everyday iow prices! We have styles for 
everyone, ali available in junior sizes 3-13

9.88 «> 12.88 sale 8.88
Junior Fashion Tops
Two special groups of favorite tops at our 
everyday low prices Choose from fashion's 
best colors and a wide range of junior sizes

"Capri" 3 Pc. Towel Set
Reg. 9.97 per set. Cannon's- cotton and 
polyester hemmed jacquard towel set in 
colors of almond, rose, parchment, or blue.

We Accept

321 Main Street Open 8 to6

t
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School Changes
Cont. From Page 1

increase for complished. Meetings
throughout

a salary 
teachers.

Factors which affected 
the 1983-84 school salary 
total are: J. teachers sal­
aries increased on an aver­
age of 1.9 percent to 4.6 
percent as provided by law;
2. reduction in staff 
(five/teachers was a sav­
ings of approximately 
$75,000; 3. Several posi­
tions were filled with indi­
viduals with less experience 
than those resigning, also 
providing a reduction in the 
salary total.

Fuller stated that he was 
excited that he could rec­
ommend approval of a sal­
ary schedule that produced 
a total salary less than the 
preceding year. “ This will 
help as we continue to 
build an economical budget 
since last years salaries 
were 70 percent of our total 
school expenditures, “ Ful­
ler added.

An executive session by 
the School Board was 
brought to an end and the 
following action taken on 
personnel: resignations
were accepted from James 
Pope and Vicki Brandon. 
Leaves of absnece were 
granted to Jo Ann Hering- 
ton, Diane Skipworth and 
Jan King.

Teaching contracts were 
approved for the 1983-84 
year for: Lonnie Scott, 
high school teacher and 
coach; Jerry Johnson, high 
school teacher and coach 
and Ray Donaldson, junior 
high teacher and coach. 
Also for Gayle Fuller, ele­
mentary teacher; Roxie 
Johnson, junior high teach­
er and coach; Ginger Cald­
well, junior high teacher; 
Twila Albertson, junior 
high teacher, Lilly Snitker, 
elementary teacher; Deb­
orah Hammer, eleme,:'.ary 
teacher and Donna Krey, 
homebound teacher.

Included in the informa­
tional portion of the board 
meeting was a report on 
the 1983-84 budget. Super 
inteadent Fuller gave the 
Board an analysis of the 
budget, which is signif­
icantly smaller than the 
1982-83 budget. All build­
ing principals and the ath­
letic director were asked to 
reduce their budgets by ten 
percent and this was sc­

are
planned throughout the 
month of August as well as 
a Budget Hearing on Aug­
ust 22 and the public is 
invited to participate in the 
committee meetings. Final 
approval of the budget is 
set for August 30.

Property insurance pro­
posals were reviewed by 
board members and in later 
action, they elected to join 
the Texas Association of 
School Boards Insurance 
Program, with the self in­
suring program saving the 
district a significant amount 
of money.

Fuller shared with Board 
Members an administrative 
plan regarding a faculty 
advisory council to be 
formed this year. The pur­
pose of the formation 
would be to establish form­
al communication lines be­
tween campus teachers and 
central administrators.

Board Member Julie 
Cage reported that the 
committee investigating 
extra-curricular budgeting 
is continuing to meet and 
is awaiting sample policies 
from another school 
district.

Jennyslippers...
Cont. From Page 1 
ers at the July 4 celebra­
tion were invited to per­
form by the Jennyslippers. 
They plan to continue this 
activity. To date, and since 
October, 1982, the Wo­
men’s Division of the 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture has contributed 
approximately $3400 to lo­
cal causes for the detter- 
ment of the Muleshoe 
community

Several guests were rec­
ognized, as well as one 
new member, Donna Nor­
iega, before the meeting 
was dismissed. Members 
and guests then provided 
their own entertainment by 
playing miniature golf.

Donald Regan. Treasury 
Secretary:
“ As it stands now...it 

looks as though the 
economy is good for the 
next four quarters and 
probably beyond.”

Pipeline Permit Summary Tax Rebate
Railroad Commission 

Chairman Mack Wallace 
has announced that 21 per­
mits to operate new pipe­
lines in Texas were granted 
by the RRC in June. In 
May, the Commission ap­
proved 12 permits, and 17 
were granted in June 1982.

Fifteen of the new per­
mits were for gathering 
pipelines, two were for gas 
plant lines, and one was 
for a trunk transmission 
line. Three were for multi­
purpose lines. Gathering 
lines bring oil and gas from 
production leases, while a 
trunk transmission line is 
larger diameter line into 
which smaller lines con­
nect. At gas plants, gas is 
stripped of the liquid hy­
drocarbons usually present 
in wellhead gas.

Sixteen of the newly- 
permitted lines will trans­
port gas, three will carry 
crude oil, one will carry 
products and another will 
move salt water.

In June, four permits 
each were granted to op­
erate pipelines in Southeast 
Texas, West Central Texas, 
and North Texas; two each 
in East Texas and the San 
Antonio and San Angelo 
areas; and one each in East 
Central Texas and the Re­
fugio and Midland areas. 
Gathering lines approved:

Bengal Gas Transmission 
Co., San Antonio, gas, 
Callahan County; Corsicana 
Drilling Co., Corsicana, 
crude oil, Navarro County; 
Gene Powell Investments 
Inc., Longview, gas, Rusk 
County; Woodh„m Oil

Burgess...
Cont. From Page 1

ment in the field of 
nursing.

Burgess, daughter of Jim 
and Elaine Burgess of 
Muleshoe, is a nurse tech­
nician at Northwest Texas 
Hospital at Amarillo. She 
also is a member of Alpha 
Chi national honor society 
and has been listed in 
Who’s Who Among Stu­
dents in American Univers­
ities and Colleges.

Following graduation, 
Burgess said she plans to 
work as a nurse in . a 
mission overseas

Corp., Fulshear, gas, Zav­
ala County; B & B Gather­
ing !nc., Jacksboro, gas, 
Jack County; LTX Inc., 
Abilene, gas, Fisher 
County; Petro Rose, Bay 
City, two lines-one for 
crude oil and another for 
salt water in Matagorda
County; Bravo Gas Co., 
Lufkin, gas, Rusk and Pan­
ola County; Richards Pro­
ducing Co., Houston, gas, 
Wharton County; Allco Ex­
ploration Co., Houston, 
gas, Madison County; 
Champlin Gas Pipeline 
Inc., Midland, gas, Sterling 
and Reagan counties; Mor­
row Resources Inc., Odes­
sa, gas, Tom Green 
County; Bethany Oil Co., 
Shreveport, La. gas, 
Shackelford County; Buffalo 
Pipeline Co., Breckenridge, 
crude oil and condensate, 
McMullen County.

Gas plant lines approved:

Kibo Compressor Corp., 
Wichita Falls, gas, Wil­
barger County; Champlin 
Petroleum Co., Midland.

gas. Sterling and Glasscock 
counties.

Trunk transmission lines 
approved:

Corpus Christi Gas Gath­
ering Inc., Corpus Christi, 
gas, Live Oak County.

Multi-purpose and other 
lines approved:

Crawtord Energy Inc., 
Austin, products, Harde­
man County; Lindell 
O’Neal, Nocona, gas, Mon­
tague County; LTX Inc., 
Abilene, gas, Nolan
County,

Baseball,..
Cont. From Page 1

the Lions; Joe Orozco and 
Timmy Shipman from the 
K-Bars; Veterans-J.J. Met­
calf and Roque Flores, Jr. 
and from the Longhorns, 
Brian Glover, Kevin
McGeehee, Eddie Zamora, 
Omar Sanchez and Wes 
Jarman. Team manager 
was Evaristo Sanchez and 
coach is Tom Waldrop.

Farm Tour
sented have a nomadic live­
stock industry, particular 
interest was expressed in 
methods ai establishing 
permanent improved gra­
zing and haying operations.

Following the bus tours, 
visitors returned to the 
farm headquarters and 
were given a guided visit 
« the seed barns where 

the seed is tored, cleaned 
and bagged.

Dr. Vaughan stated that 
the group would spend 
about four weeks in touring 
and five weeks in classes, 
as well as the first week 
which was spent in Wash­
ington for orientation.

It was pointed out to the 
group that Bamert Farms 
has shipped out millet seed 
this past year to both 
Africa and to Italy. Some of 
this seed will be used for 
food. This is the fifth year 
that Carl Bamert, owner of 
Bamert Farms has cooper­
ated in this tour for foreign 
agriculturists. He also
works very closely with the

Cont. From Page 1
Soil Conservation Service in 
addition to other organiza­
tions.

boosted them up to 
$268,445.68 and giving 
them a 3.68 percent in­
crease over the $258,906.11 
figure in 1982 for the same 
time frame.

In Hockley County, each 
of the four towns showed 
deficits in tax rebates with 
the City of Levelland being 
the largest reporting city. 
Levelland's rebate for this 
period amounted to 
$28,012.30, drastically 
down from the $41,807.56 
at the same time in 1982. 
Total 1983 payments to 
date for Levelland amount­
ed to $348,036.17, down by 
15.02 percent to date from 
the $409,541.67 for 1982. 
The entire county reflected 
a 19.93 percent deficit in 
rebate money for 1983 to 
date.

Lamb County’s largest 
reporting city of Littlefield 
showed a 2.26 percent in­
crease from 1982 to 1983, 
allowing the county total to 
come up to .38 percent to 
the good. Littlefield re­
ceived net payment for the 
period just past in the 
amount of $10,369.%, 
down slightly from the 
$10,875.13 in 1982. Their 
total payments to date for 
1983 have reached 
$134,094.21 up by 2.26 

from the
of 1982 total

Cont. From Page 1
west, received $1,166.86 
net payment for the July 
period, up from the $707.95 
at the same time in 1982. 
Overall payments for 1983 
to date for Harwell amount 
to $13,027.76, up by 8.35 
percent over the $12,023.83 
of 1982. In Friona however, 
July tax rebates were down 
by 5.38 percent. Parmer 
County showed an overall 
deficit of 2.46 percent from 
1982 figures.

Houston received the 
largest check--$6.8 milliom 
bringing this year’s total to 
$75.8 million, down 9 per­
cent from 1982. Dallas’ 
payment totaled $4.2 mil­
lion for a total $45.9 mil­
lion, up 8 percent from last 
year. San Antonio’s pay­
ment was $2.1 million, 
putting 1983 receipts at 
$22.6 million, a 9 percent 
increase.

Austin’s July payment 
was $1.5 million, bringing

the year’s total to $15 mil­
lion, 15 percent over last 
year. Fort Worth received 
$1.3 million to put the 
city's 1983 total at $14.8 
million, up 8 percent from 
1982. El Paso’s check was 
$798,000, with 1983 total 
payments down 10 percent 
from last year.

Bullock also sent checks 
to the state’s two Metro­
politan Transit Authorities. 
Houston's MTA received 
$7.8 million, down from 
last July’s payment of $9.4 
million. San Antonio re­
ceived $1.1 million, bring­
ing the yearly total to $12.4 
million, up 10 percent over 
1982.

The City and MTA sales 
taxes are collected along 
with the state sales tax by 
merchants and rebated 
monthly to the cities in 
which they are collected by 
the Comptroller.

The July checks were for 
taxes collected on sales 
made in May and reported 
to the Comptroller by the 
end of June.

M M M
FLYING SERVICE, INC.

5 Miles North V2 West Of Lazbuddie

r>

Rotary...

The Stockholders
Of The

Farmers Co-op Elevators
Are Invited 

To The

Annual Stockholders
Meeting

Friday, July 22,8 p.m.
At The

Muleshoe High School Cafeteria
There Will Be

•  Election Of Directors
•  Dividend Checks Given
•  A Mealf Catered By Country 
Catering Of Muleshoe

0
/ a

So-Mark Your Calendars
Stockholders, &  Be Sure 

To Attend!

See You There!

Cont. From Page 1
stated.’ She also pointed out 
that it took over 4600 peo­
ple to maintain Cannon Air 
Force Base and the total 
population is approximately 
10,000 at this time.

Guests at Rotary includ­
ed Joel Ware, Mark Will­
iams, John Actkinson, 
Kennan McCanless, Clifton 
Finley, Lance King and 
Brad Poyner.

All members were re­
minded of a special prog­
ram on Tuesday, July 26 
by Don McElroy. McElroy 
has arranged to have offi­
cials of the Underground 
Water Committee present 
the program.

percent 
$131,135.26 
payments.

Farwell,
neighboring

Muleshoe’s 
city to the

Rather
Bachelor-A man who 

would rather wash a pair 
of socks than a pan full of 
dishes.

Wise Bunnies
We have never known 

a rabbit that was super­
stitious enough to carry 
the left hind foot of a man.

-Enquirer, Cincinnati.

Definition
P r o p a g a n d a :  The  

other side presented so 
convincingly it makes you 
mad.
-Chronicle, San Francisco.

MITCH AUTRY
(806) 272-4803

SKIP MAGBY
(806) 965-2793

Quality Service In Aerial Application 

Liquid Fertilizer, Herbicides & Insecticides

HdRRY

Sale Will Continue Thru The 23rd
All Sales Final 

Limited To Stock On Hand

O

1 Gallon Water

J u g

Reg. $4”

r

Black 
Decker 

’/j" Electric 
Impact

Wrench
Reg 153“

$124“

~ o  \
Case /
No. 215 /  

KnHeSet / ase 
Reg 67* / no.198 

#4ajo /  Ktahen
? /  Knife Set

/  Reg 53*

/  $29“

/  o  \

Sharp

C a lc u la to r

W/Clock 

Reg 3812

$ 2 6 ” . ,

. A

f  o  \
Case A

/

7

K n ife  S e t
With Block 

R ^ .  76“

lawn Chief

Roto-Tiller
5 HP 
Reg 399”

Sale

✓
* °

Window

Sunshade

Close-

Out

Price

Turtle Wax
Reg 4”

$r

Campbell Hausfeld 
1 HP Air 

Compressor

Reg 359“ S H
. 16“ w/case 

$ 2 6 5 7  Reg 269“

$235“

Black & Decker

W o rk  M a t e
Reg 99”

$79”

o

Sharp

M e m o w r ite r

No. EL-7001 

Reg 133 '2

$99”

401 S. First

U

No . 84
Knife Set

With Slant PXvk' 
Reg 76*

20 Gallon 
LP

Water Heater
Reg 177” / Pomiork
1 9 4 *  /  So*or fente 

Charier
Reg 179”

G a rd e n  S e e d l
Reg. 59* Pkg.

25 For

$i“

x, Inc.
272-4511
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DEADLINE FOR CLASSIFIED 
ADS IS TUESDAYS AND 

FRIDAYS 11:00AM

10. FARM EQUIP. 
FOR SALE

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion 

Per Word....1.15 
Minimum Charge...$2.30 

2nd Insertion
Per Word..... $.13

Minimum Charge...$2.00 
CARD OF THANKS

Per Word..... $.20
CLASSIFIED DISPLAY 
$1.70..per column inch 

BUND AD RATES 
50% more 

DEADLINES 
11 a.m. Tues. for Thurs. 

11 a.m. Fri. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

AN Y AD. NOT 
RESPONSIBLE FOR 

ANY ERROR AFTER AD 
HAS RUN ONCE.

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE ]

We buy used aluminum 
pipe, side roll systems. 
We also repair and sell 
other types of irrigation 
equipment. Water Dog 
Irrigation Co. Littlefield, 
Tx. 385-4620.
15-25s- 13tc

Garage Sale Ads 

Must Be Pre-Paid.

1 PERSONALS 1

Book a TUPPERWARE par­
ty and receive lots of free 
hostess gifts. Call 8 a. m. to 
8 p.m. 927-54'II.
l-28s-4tc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3
br, 2 bath brick home. r  -------------------
Fireplace, carpeted garage. I 11. FOR SALE 
Beautiful yard & covered | OR TRADE 
patio. Close to high school. '
272-3402 or 272-3839. m w i
8-1Qc-tfr FOR SALE: 1981 Mobile
...........................:................... Home 14x70 ft. 2 bedroom,
HOUSE FOR SALE: 2350 2 bath'. f,ul|y furnished‘ F°r
sq. ft. 3 bedroom. 2 baths. ' n a t i o n  call:
formal living room, den £
with fireplace, dining room, *'btP
kitchen, laundry room with, .......................... ....................
sewing center, basement, LOR SALE: 14 ft. Jon boat,
double car garage, patio, flat bottom. Call 272-3881.
storage shed, 2 lots. Lo- ll-29t-4tc
cated 1 Vi mile east from .......................... ....................
Earth, Texas on hwy 70. FOR SALE: 17 ft. upright
Call (806) 257-3785. Freezer, new compressor.
8-14s tfc 272-3227.
............................................... 11 -29t-1 tc
EXTRA NICE 3-1‘/j-1. New ...............................................
carpet, paneling through FOR SALE: 3 br, 2 bath
out. Screened in patio Call unfurnished mobile home.
4541 or 5671 after 5:00’ for information call
p.m. Ask for Debby. 272-5370.
8-13t-tfc 1 l-23t-tfc

CONCERNED 
about someone’s 

drinking
HELP IS AVAILABLE 

through Al-Anon 
Call 227-2350 or 965-2207 
or come to visit Tuesday 
nights. 8:30 p.m. at 1116 
W American Boulevard, 
Muleshoe. 
l-18s-tfc

2. LOST AND FOUND

3 LOTS FOR SALE: 
Here in Muleshoe. 1800 
American Blvd. Call: Lela 
Gatlin Rt. 2 Box 167 Port- 
ales, N.M. (505) 356-6168.
8-29s-2tp

TRAILER SPACE for rent.
Call 272-3006
!5-28s-tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
bedroom brick house, 2 
bath, living room, den with 
fireplace, double car gar­
age. Richland Hills.
Call 272-3214 for appoint­
ment.
8-29t-tfc

LOST BLACK MALE Cock- 
erspaniel and pepper color­
ed male cairn-terrier. Vaci- 
nitv of the Catholic Church. 
Call 272-5045.
2-29t-ltc

3. HELP WANTED

WANTED: Person to run 
snow-cone route, part-time, 
4 hours a day. Mostly eve­
nings. Must have driver’s 
license. Call 272-3159 
29t-3-2tc

WANTED:
Sales Representative for 
Ag.-Chemical or Roofing 
Systems of Lubricants. Call 
for appointment. 647-5517
3-1 ltp-28t

ATTENTION MALE: 18-22 
years old, high-school 
graduate, farm background, 
selling on commission. 
Furnish own vehicle. Con­
tact by phone 986-3111. 
3-29s-4tc

W/lWrEDFull-charge Book­
keeper with computer exp­
erience. Call: 946-3321. 
3-tfc-28t

NEED FARM worker. Ex­
perience required. Top 
wages. 965-2259 anytime, 
272-3257 after 6 p.m. 
3-27s-tfc

PART-TIME help wanted: 
Good Benefits. Apply at 
Town and Country Food 
Store 1900 W. Amer. Blvd.

, „  „ W9  m m
’ KREBBS REAL ESTATE^ 
,'If it's Real Estate yoid 
►want, we have it or can^ 
► get it.

-Appraisals- 
Tele. 272-3191-office and< 
residence

8-16s-tfc

Bingham & Nieman 
Realty

116 E. Ave. C 
272-5285 272-5286

‘‘We Appreciate 
Your Business!

George & Dianne 
Nieman

8-!t-tfc

NEW HOMES 

No Down Payment 

Low Monthly Payment 

You May Qualify!

Am e r ic a n  
^ a l l e y

J NVESTMENTS
R E A LTO R S

Rex Harris John Craig 
Broker Builder

FOR SALE: Roper Range 
$150.00. 1 yr old. 312 W. 
Ave K. 272-5181. 
1 l-29s-2tc

FOR SALE: Chow puppies. 
7 weeks old. $75.00. 
965-2162 
1 l-2tp-29s

HOME REPAIRS. F.M. 
Saldana Construction. Lic­
ensed and bonded plumber. 
Specialize in cement, car­
penter work, remodeling, 
painting, acoustical ceil­
ings. 272-4955.
15-16s-tfc

WANTED: Used Honey 
Extractor. 272-4536. 
tfc

HONEY FOR SALE

Nick Landers 
334 W. Ave. J. 

272-3096
15-5t-tfc

Freezer-Norge-chest type. 
25 cubic feet. 272-5617 or 
272-3487 
ll-tfc-28t

Ladies Schwin Bicycle 5 
speed.
27-5617 or 272-3487 
ll-tfc-28t

MUST SELL: several all- 
steel pre-engineered metal 
buildings. Never Erected 
Call (817) 566-3000 or 
566-3182 (Willing to Deal) 
ll-29s-2tp

FOR SALE: Pure bred Red 
Doberman puppies. Males, 
$45, Females $35. Call
272-5317 after 6 p.m.
24s-11-tfc

12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

WE BUY USED 
FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
15-5t-tfc

| 15. MISCELLANEOUS

9 AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE

3-29t-2tc

7. WANTED TO RENT j

WANTED TO RENT: Nice, 
Clean 2-3 Bedroom-Unfurn­
ished Home, With Garage 
or Carport. Single, Well 
Employed Male. Call Roy, 
272-4511 before 6 p.m., 
Monday-Saturday.
7-29t-tfc

FOR SALE: 1975 Plymouth 
Duster. A.C. Very Depend­
able. $1,100. 272-3963.
9-29t-tfc

FOR SALE: 1980-F150 Ford 
1 ton P.U. 4WD-w/auto- 
matic. Lock out holes, AM- 
FM 8 track, Mag wheels, 
dual exhaust. Black and 
Silver. $7,000. 51,000
miles. Call 272-5317, after 
6 p.m.
9-tfc

| 8. REAL ESTATE 10. FARM EQUIP.
1 FOR SALE FOR SALE

FOR SALE: 3 BR, 1 bath, 
fireplace, enclosed patio, 1 
car garage with Genie 
door, lots of storage. Under 
$40,000. 272-5197.
8-27s-tfc

FOR SALE: Avenger 3- 
Wheel hoe hands with 
spray tanks attached. Call 
First National Bank 
272-4515.
10-21 t-tfc

U  RES—  m  
RIGHT TO CLASSIFY. 
REVISE OR REJECT 

ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 

AFTER AD HAS RUN
ONCE.

15. MISCELLANEOUS

WANT TO BUY Ruby Red
Glassware - single piece or 
more to complete set again. 
Call Cleta 272-4536 week­
days, or 272-3279 nights 
and weekends, 
tfc

ALEX’S TIRE SERVICE
For service 24 hours a day 
telephone 272-5012 or Mo­
bile 965-2242. 224 East
Fourth Street, Muleshoe," 
Tx. 79347.
15-5s-stfc

Round-up Application 
30” or 40” Rows 

Cotton Milo, Soybeans 
and Layout. Pipe Wick 
Mounted or Hi-Boy.

Call: Roy O’Brian 
265-3247

15-27s-9tp_____________

S U M B U R S T j ? '

6 ,0  Hum

WITH A NATURALLY 

BALANCED FORMULA 

OF MICRONUTRIENTS 

PLUS SOIL AND TISSUE 

ANALYSIS 

FOR COMPLETE 

PI ANT BALANCE 

Ted Millen

Lazbuddie, Tx.
15-27s-12tc

TOO LATE 
TO CLASSIFY

Winnebago Camper top 
Cabhigh insulated has
windows, for long wide bed 
pick-up, has mattress
frame. Call 272-4255 
29t-tltc-3tc

After
Deadline???
You can call 

272-4536 

until 5:30 p.m. 

on Friday and 

Tuesday and get 

your WORD AD in 

T00-LATE-T0 CLASSIFY 

in the next issue!!! 

Tuesday for Thursday 

and Friday for Sunday.

GARAGE SALE 322 Ave. 
J. Friday and Saturday 
morning.
15-29t-ltp

GARAGE SALE: Sat. July 
23, from 9:00 a.m. to 6:00 
p.m. 1902 W. Ave. D. 
15-29t-ltp.

ESTATE GARAGE SALE: 
Saturday and Sunday, July 
23, 24. 9 a.m. till ? Lots of 
collectibles. 519 W. 5th. 
15-29t-1 tc

FRANKS 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICF 
PARTS & REPAIR

315 W. 3rd. Ph. 272-3822 
15-5t-tfc

Tri State Fair 
Plans Mow 
Underway

The 1983 Amarillo Tri 
State Fair is gearing up for 
a variety of competitions in 
connection with the fair, 
September 3-10. Divisions 
include livestock, poultry, 
art, needlework, culinary 
and agricultural exhibits. 
This year, a total of 
$100,564.00 will be offered 
in prize money to pros­
pective exhibitors. The cat­
egories include: Angus, 
Hereford, Shorthorn and 
Longhorn Cattle Shows - 
$23,947.00; Barrows and 
Lambs - $8,750.00; Steers 
and Junior Heifers - 
$11,130.00; Open Sheep 
Show - $4,950.00; Capons. 
Bantams and Rabbits - 
$1,491.00; Agricultural Dis­
plays and Home Economic 
Exhibits - $1,500.00; Art 
Show - $1,110.00; Culinary, 
Textiles, China Painting 
and Ceramics - $2,686.00; 
Appaloosa. Arabian, Paint, 
Quarter Horse, Cutting and 
Open Horse Shows - 
$45,000.00. The Tri State 
Fair invites anyone inter­
ested to find out more 
about these competitions. 
Those wishing to display 
livestock or personal skills 
may obtain the specific 
rules and entry deadlines 
by calling the fair office - 
806/376-7767 or by writing 
P.O. Box 31087, Amarillo, 
Texas 79120.

Sudan Mews
By

Evelyn Ritchie
***

Mrs. J.P. Arnold and 
Doyle Terrell were among 
those from Sudan who have 
been or are patients in the 
Amherst Hospital recently. 
Others include Alice Mc­
Carty, Elizabeth Walden, 
Roy Graves, Jackie Mark­
ham and O.C. Markham.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Byron 

Ford were in Ruidoso, 
N.M. recently and visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. Buddy 
Pickett.

***
Martha Lowe, an RN at 

South Plains Hospital in 
Amherst will be leaving 
soon after having spent the 
past six years working at 
the Amherst Hospital.

She and her family will 
be moving to Lorenzo 
where hei husband, Mack, 
will be teaching and coach­
ing, Mack has been a 
coach and teacher in the 
Sudan schools the past six 
years.

Employees of the Am­
herst Hospital gave a going 
away party for Martha last 
Wednesday in the confer­
ence room at the hospital 
and had a cake trimmed in 
blue and yellow, punch and 
also presented her with two 
paintings as farewell gifts

The Lowes will be great­
ly missed in Sudan but we 
do wish them well in their 
new home and school.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Mills 

of Odessa visited during 
the weekend with her par­

ents, Mr. and Mrs. Ray­
mond Harper and family.

•**
Mrs. Ann Arnold and 

Jana of San Antonio have 
been here visiting her 
mother, Mrs. Esther Meeks 
and also with Mr. and Mrs. 
J.P. Arnold.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Elray 

Rasco and Gayla have been 
vacationing in Ruidoso, 
N.M. recently.

Mr. and Mrs. Tom Rigs­
by were in San Antonio 
during the holidays with 
relatives.

#**
Mr. and Mrs. Terry 

Tennyson and family vaca­
tioned during the holidays 
at Lake Proctor and also 
have been in Stephenville 
on business.

***
Charity Van Ness of Ft 

Worth has been visiting 
recently with her grand­
mother, Mrs. Elizabeth 
Walden.

•**
Mrs. Eloise Baccus and 

children of Spring left Sun­
day for Syracuse, N.Y. 
following a visit here with 
their parents. Mr. and 
Mrs. Jack Engram and Mr. 
and Mrs. Doyle Baccus and 
other family members. The 
children will be competing 
in the National Unicycle 
meet there and will then go 
on to Purchase, N.Y. where 
Scot will be in the National 
Junior Meet for Jugglers.

***
Correction: Doyle Patton 

furnished the car in which 
Mayor and Mrs. Kenneth 
Wiseman rode in the July 
Celebration parade. Last 
weeks edition stated that it 
was furnished by Dutch 
Wilkinson.

Stephanie Gore, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Billy Gore 
of Odessa has been here 
visiting her grandparents, 
Mr and Mrs. Wayne Doty 
and Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Gore and other family 
members.

***
Visiting recently with 

Rhoda Minyard has been 
her grandchildren, Monica, 
Stephanie and Ernie, child­
ren of Mr. and Mrs. Pat 
Minyard of Lubbock.

**•
Our Apologies;-In last 

weeks paper the following 
names were unintentionally 
omitted from the list of 
those attending the class of 
1963 reunion: Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Baccus (Eloise 
Engram) of Spring, Texas.

Those omitted from the 
reunion of the class of 1968 
were Mr. and Mrs. Sidney
Chance of Lubbock.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 

Mooney and Travis of Can­
yon visited during the holi­
days with his mother, Mrs. 
T.C. Mooney and his broth­
er, and sister, Elaine 
Hollingsworth and Lee 
Anne.

***
Visiting last Thursday 

with Mr. and Mrs. J.C. 
Wells were his sisters, 
Mrs. Belle Ogden and Elsie 
Caraway of Lubbock and 
also a niece, Mr. and Mrs.
Cletie Scoggins.

***
Mrs. Craig Doty and 

Kimberley were released 
from the Amherst Hospital 
Monday.

t  * * *
A smart lawyer can 

find a “ case” to uphold 
any act of man.

Information 

For Veterans
Editor’s Note: Following 

are representative ques­
tions answered daily by VA 
counselors. Full information 
is available at any VA 
office.

VA - MAY I HELP YOU?
Q--My only income is 

from a VA pension and we 
have had a rash of thefts 
lately. Is there some way I 
can protect myself against 
the loss of my check?

A-Yes. VA compensation 
checks may be deposited 
directly to your savings or 
checking account. Go to 
your bank and fill out a 
Standard Form 1199a.

Q- May 1 use my GI Bill 
eligibility to attend school 
in a foreign country?

A--Foreign training under 
the Gl Bill is only available 
in degree programs in ap­
proved '■olleges ind univ­
ersities. Local v A regional 
offices have a list of ap­
proved schools.

Q -I receive compensa­
tion from the VA for a
10-percent service-conn­
ected disability. I am also 
eligible for nonservice- 
connected disability pension 
benefits. Will 1 receive two 
checks?

A-No. A veteran cannot 
receive both compensation 
and pension benefits based 
on his own service. The VA 
will pay you the greater 
benefit unless you elect in 
writing to receive the lesser 
benefit.

•**
If you lose interest in

life, you are dying.

VALCOM
FARM COMPUTER CENTER

IBM Personal Computer
v - w  ■

Specialized 
Agricultural Software

Help from the people 
who know agriculture

Be sure you get all three
Can you afford to deal w ith anyone who 

doesn 't provide all of the above? W hen you 're  
planning to use a com puter for your business, 
anything less than real pro fess iona l help 
will fall short in helping you im prove your 
bottom line.

As ValCom dealers, w e know agricu lture . 
That's our business. M ost of our 
agricultural software program s were 
written by farm ers for their ow n op e ra ­
tions. All of our program s have been V

We think the IBM Personal C om puter 
speaks for itself. And we ve been tra ined by 
IBM to se rv ice  their Personal C om puter right 
here. We also ca rry  a com ple te  line of the 
o ther supp lies you II need to keep your co m ­
puter going.

S top by. We ll show you just how easy it is 
to  keep your farm  records, figure  a 
least-cost ration, or ana lyze a cropp ing 
program . O ur ValCom program s will 
lead you through step-by-step  You'll

tested and proven by fa rm ers t » n .  m    have com ple te  confidence in what
and growers. l i W M t W i W  you 're  doing.

Come in for a hands on demonstration.
See for yourself how we can help 

you improve your bottom line.

Cal Jordan Implements
EAST MABRY DRIVE CLOVIS, N.M.

P.O. Box 1110 763-5517



CONVENIENCE STORES

PRICES EFFECHVE JULY 21 -23.1983 
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST 

OPEN 24 HOURS SELF-SERVE BAS
1 LB CAN 

ALL
FOLGERS

FRESH POPPED

GOLD MEDAL

FLOUR
ALLSUP'S

GALLON

HUNTS KETCHUP

KETCHUP
ALLSUP'S

1'/a LB LOAF

SHURFINE

Adults interested in pur­
suing leaching careers can 
obtain information on be­
coming certified in Texas 
by attending the “ Work­
shop on Teaching Careers” 
Saturday, Aug. 13 at Texas 
Tech University. Sponsored 
by the College of Education 
and Division of Conti.«’’ing 
Education, the workshop 
will meet 8:30 a.m. to noon 
in Room 150, Administra­
tion/ Education Building.

Sessions are designed for 
people who have college 
credits but not a degree 
and for those with an 
earned degree who lack 
teacher certification. The 
fee is $18.

Workshop leader Dr. 
Shamus Mehaffie, associate

Record number of prison­
ers on death row.

For the low est prices on s tee l bu ild ings in the o rea -C o n tac t 
A&M Building Systems. D irect fac to ry  q u a lity  and v a lu e .

Built To Your Spocificotions 
No Middleman-Direct To You

Com plete erectio n  and concrete p ro v id ed  by A&M's exp erien ced
concrete and construction crews.

CaV*

t  1 -800-545-2255
2600 E. Mabry Drive, Clovis, N.M.

The Senior Citizens had 
their first meeting 8:00 
p.m. Monday July 11, at 
the Community Center, 
Guests singers were from 
Muleshoe, Mr. and Mrs. 
John Gunter, Mr. and Mrs. 
J.C. Shanks, Mr. and Mrs. 
Zed Robinson, Mrs. Clara 
Coffman, Mrs. Mae Wilt- 
erding, Mrs. Wilbanks and 
Mrs. Eoa Ashborn, there 
were 34 present with 7 new 
members. Mr. and Mrs. 
Zed Robinson, Mr. and 
Mrs. E.N. McCall, Mr. and 
Mrs. Edd Autry, and Mrs. 
Winnie Bvars.

Refreshments of cookies, 
cake, punch, tea and coffee 
were served by the re­
freshment committee.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Cecil

Report shows pollution 
down in major cities.

While marketing of fed 
cattle in May was up 12 
percent from last year, re­
duced placements of cattle 
on feed indicate that beef 
supplies are going to be 
tight later in the year, says 
Dr. Edward Uvacek, Jr., 
economist in livestock 
marketing with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, Texas A&M Univer­
sity System.

The June seven-state 
cattle on feed report shows 
that large supplies of cattle 
are being marketed and 
that the April-June quarter 
will probably be close to 
the 9 percent increase an­
ticipated earlier in the 
year, Uvacek says.

But continued low place­
ment levels during May as 
in recent months are going 
to result in a fed cattle

marketing level of 9 to 10 
percent below last year for 
the July-September quar­
ter, he says.

He adds that unless 
placements increase drasti­
cally within the next few 
weeks, the fourth quarter 

ONE MINUTE SPORTS QUIZ
1. Who won the Byron 
Nelson Golf Classic?
2. Who won the LPGA CPC 
International tournament?
3. Moses Malone plays pro 
basketball for what team?
4. Tony Perez plays pro 
baseball for what team?
5. Name the first coach of 
the Minnesota Vikings.
Answer* To Sports Qniz
1. Ben Crenshaw.
2. Hollis Stacy.
3. Philadelphia 76ers.
4. Philadelphia Phillies.
5. The late Norm Van 
Brocklin.

fed marketings will also be 
substantially reduced 

This reduced fed cattle 
supply, however, will be 
partially offset by some in­
creased pork production, he 
maintains.

Fortunately, broiler pro­
duction should remain be­
low the level of a year ago, 
at least during the next 
three or four months. Both 
chick placements and egg 
hatchings have been from 1 
to 2 percent below last year 
for the last several weeks. 
Thus, beefs competition 
from other meats should 
only be up slightly during 
the rest of 1983.

Useful
No one is completely 

useless-you can always 
serve as a bad example.

-Jax Air News.

BUILDING 
SYSTEMS INC.

"Lasting Value From 

The Ground Up"

STEEL
BUILDINGS

Fair Added Dairy Goat Show

NEW TELEPHONE SYSTEM INSTALLED... Sandy Bass, 
secretary at Valley Grain Company of Muleshoe, takes a 
call on the new Mitel SX-20 PABX Telephone System, 
recently sold and installed by Five Area Systems, Inc. The 
new system has a capacity of 12 lines and 48 extensions or 
8 lines and 72 extensions.

Teaching Career

A dairy goat show for 
junior and senior does has 
been added to the livestock 
judging calendar of the 
66th annual Panhandle- 
South Plains Fair this fall.

Shiela Nixon of Hilmar, 
Calif., will judge the new 
competition, according to 
Steve L. Lewis, fair general 
manager.

Walter A. Brown will be 
show superintendent, Laura 
Fay Appleton, secretary 
and Ken Smith, ring 
steward.

This show is sanctioned 
for Alpine, Nubian and all 
other purebred breeds by 
the American Dairy Goat 
Association and its rules 
will govern all phases of 
competition.

Only American Dairy 
Goat Association, American 
Goat Society and Canadian 
Goat Society registered, re­
corded or applied-for ani­
mals may be shown in an 
official ADGA Show.

Non-returnable entry fees 
of $5 per head must be 
sent prior to Sept. 20 to

Mrs. Appleton at Route 1, 
Box 16. Abernathy, Tex.
79311.

Showmanship judging is 
slated for 8:30 a.m. on 
Sept. 24, date of the show 
and opening day of the 
eight-day fair run. Junior 
does will be judged at 9 
a.m. and senior does will 
follow.

Groups to be judged by 
breed are junior get of sire, 
senior get of sire, produce 
of dam, best three females, 
dairy herd and dam and 
produce.

The premium list in­
cludes $10, $8, $6, and S4 
for first through fourth 
spots in individual classes 
and $5, S4, S3 and $2 for 
group classes.

Cash awards of $50 and 
trophies will go to the best 
junior doe, best senior doe 
(best of the three grand 
champions of each breed) 
and best udder in the 
show.

Meanwhile, negotiations 
for top entertainers to open 
a n ^ c l o s ^ J h e l 9 & ^ x g o ^

sition continue, Lewis said. 
Contracts for the Sept. 24 
and Oct. 1 dates have not 
been finalized and will be 
announced as soon as they 
are completed.

However, the remainder 
of the card is firm, with 
Reba McEntire and the 
Maines Brothers scheduled .  
to co-headline shows at 4 •  
p.m. and 7 p.m. on Sept.
26.

It will be the only show 
featuring an opening act.
All others will be one-hour 
shows with no intermission 
at 7 p.m. and 9 p.m. daily. 
Those include Larry Gatlin 
and the Gatlin Brothers 
band, Sept. 27; Ronnie g  
Milsap, Sept. 28; Conway 
Twitty, Sept. 29 and Mel 
Tillis, Sept. 30.

Tickets for all shows are 
$7 and $9 and may be ob­
tained by writing to Show 
Tickets, P.O. Box 208, 
Lubbock, Texas 79408. Re­
quests will be processed in 
toe order in which received 
and orders will be filled % 
after Aug. 1.
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Enochs News
By

Mrs. J.D. Bay less

Mrs. Dean McBee visited 
her sister, Mary Richardson 
at Levelland, Texas Friday 
till Monday afternoon. They 
also attended the old set­
tlers reunion in Levelland. 

«**
Mr. and Mrs. Cleo Hall 

of Phoenix, Arizona and 
Mrs. J.D. Bayless were 
dinner guests in the home 
of Cleo’s aunt, Mrs. J.W.
Barber Tuesday.

***
Guests in the home of 

Rev. and Mrs. Mike Heady 
Tuesday till Thursday were 
her sisters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Weldon Turner and child­
ren, Andrea and Carmen of 
Aledo, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Shields of Burleson, 
Texas.

***
Mrs. Mandy Terell and 

daughter, Jerry of Midland, 
Texas and Lee Olan Chick 
of Borger came Thursday, 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Lay- 
ton, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Bullard also Randy Snow 
all of Dell City, Texas and 
Sterling Mize and girl 
friend came Friday and 
visited Mrs. Etta Layton, 
the above group also Clyde 
Ellison and daughter, Trix­
ie of Crosbyton, Mrs. Jerry 
Nichols and children Kris­
ten and Landon of El Paso, 
Texas, Robert Layton, and 
Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Layton 
attended the weeding of 
Keith Layton and Julie 
Carlisle 7:30 p.m. Friday 
July 15, at the Three Way 
Baptist Church, then the 
group were supper guests 
in the home of Mrs. Etta 
Layton. Some of the group 
visited her till Sunday. 
Harlingen, G.H. McCall 
has been ill for several 
years, he was hospitalized 
at the General Hospital in 
Lubbock on Friday. Kelly 
returned home with his 
Dorwin McBee and family 
of Rt. Morton.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Goldman 

Stroud attended the funeral 
service of Reed Roe 3:00 
p.m. Saturday at the

Jones and Mrs. Lorella 
Jones and Wendell Jones 
attended the funeral service 
of Cecils brother, R.D. 
Jones 10:00 a.m. July 4th 
at the Church of Christ at 
Quail, burial was in the 
Quail Cemetery.

Mr. and Mrs. Edd Autry 
drove to Clovis, New Mex­
ico, Wednesday and spent 
till Saturday with their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Johnson.

Mr. and Mrs. Chester 
Petree were in Clovis, New 
Mexico Tuesday and helped 
their son Kenneth Petree 
celebrate his birthday, they 
also stopped at Farwell and 
visited a nephew, the Cal­
vin Johnson’s.

• • •
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 

Nichols are visiting his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Dale
Nichols.

***
Spending Thursday night 

with Mr. and Mrs. J.E. 
Layton was a nephew, Mr. 
and Mrs. Terry Burris of 
Wellman. Saturday night 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Lay- 
ton of Dell City spent the 
night with them.

*♦*
Mr. and Mrs. Buford 

Peterson took their grand 
children, Scott Stephanie 
and Steven Peterson to 
Sweetwater Sunday after 
they spent two weeks with 
them, they met their son, 
Mr. and Mrs. Morris Pet­
erson of Hillsboro there 
and aie lunch with them 
and the children went 
home with their parents.

***
Mr. and Mrs. E.N. Mc­

Call were in Lubbock 
Thursday night having din­
ner with their children, and 
grandchildren, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert George, Brent 
and Marthan, Mr. and 
Mrs. Steve Mosser, Chris, 
Kim, Kelly and Kery, they 
also visited Mr. and Mrs. 
G.H. McCall and George of 
Harlingen, G.H. McCall 
has been ill for several 
years, he was hospitalized 
at the General Hospital in 
Lubbock on Friday. Kelly 
returned home with his 
grandparents to spend the 
weekend.

We wish to express our 
sympathy to Mrs. Harlon 
Reese and family in the 
loss of her husband who 
died Sunday.

•*»
Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 

Jim Richardson this week 
are his sister, Mrs. Lura 
Leestalcup of Tylor, Texas 
and two grandchildren, 
Nicky and J.J. Burk of 
Dalhart, Texas.

•**
Mrs. Oney Bryant of 

Grant Junction, Colorado 
visited Mr. and Mrs. El- 
wood Autry recently they 
took her home and also 
visited the Kenneth Bry­
ants at Blue Mosa Lake, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Bry­
ant at Ridgway, Colorado 
and Mr. and Mrs. James 
Autry at Rocky Ford, 
Colorado.

***
Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 

Bill Key Saturday was his 
sisters, Mrs. Martha Meeks 
and Everett of Canadian, 
Texas, Mr. and Mrs. H.O. 
Huff and Marcus of Three 
Way, Mr. and Mrs. Bobbie 
Adams and Mrs. Bonnie 
Long of Morton also Mrs. 
Mamie Adams.

***
The Elwood Autrys met 

their 7 year old grand­
daughter Heather McDaniel 
of Houston at the Airport 
in Lubbock Saturday, she 
will be spending three 
weeks with her grandpar­
ents. Sunday afternoon 
they all went to Muleshoe 
and visited their son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mitch Autry and 
family and another grand­
daughter, Marsha came 
home with them for a visit. 

• • •
Mr. ano Mrs. Edd Autry 

drove to Tatum, New Mex­
ico Sunday to spend a few 
days with their daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy West 
and family.

***
Mr. and Mrs. Junior 

Austin and Jeff of Lubbock 
visited their parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Austin and 
Mr. and Mrs. Johnie Cox 
Friday afternoon and at­
tended the wedding of 
Keith Layton and Julie 
Carlisle.

Church of 
Levelland.

Christ ir.
Cattle Outlook Indicates Tight Supply

Workshop Scheduled Financially
dean and Texas Tech cer­
tification officer, is assisted 
by Estelle Dowdle, aca­
demic program counselor, 
and Kathy Green, academic 
program assistant.

Discussion topics include 
supply and demand for 
elementary and secondary 
teachers incluuing speciali­
zations, required compe­
tency testing in Texas, ob­
taining Texas ceiiification if 
certified in another state, 
career options in fields 
such as educational coun­
seling and administration 
and how to evaluate per­
sonal situation and qualifi­
cations when competing in 
the job market. Participants 
may have their transcripts 
evaluated and courses 
needed for certification 
itemized.

For more information, 
contact Dr. Mehaffie, Col­
lege of Education, (806) 
742-2377, or Dr. Suzan 
Schafer, Division of Con­
tinuing Education,
742-2354.

Speaking
Randall L. Field, C.P.A.
Williams, Adair, Sudduth & Co.

One out of every six American Families 
moves every year. Thkt’s one trouble with 
America - you can move somewhere 
quicker than you can think of a reason for’ 
going there. What American families 
reallv need is a new excuse to move 
somewhere. If you’re one of these fami­
lies this year, keep a record of your 
moving costs; they may be deductible.

To be deductible, your move must be 
related to beginning work in a new lo­
cation either as an employee or> as a 
self-employed individual, and your new 
job must be at least 35 miles farther from 
your old home than your old job was.

If your move qualifies, here’s what you 
can deduct:

1. Up to $1,500 of expenses for house­
hunting trips and temporary living costs 
at your new location.

2. Expenses of selling your old home 
and purchasing a new one - real estate 
commissions, attorney fees, title fees, es­
crow tees, and loan point fees. These

expenses, combined with the house­
hunting and temporary living expenses, 
are subject to a $3,000 limit. If you sell 
your house for less than you paid for it, 
you may not deduct the loss.

3. Costs of moving your household 
goods and family to the new location, 
with no dollar limit but a requirement 
that the costs be “ reasonable.”

4. The cost of transportation, meals, 
and lodging for the family while moving 
from the old home to the new home, 
subject again to the “ reasonable”  limi­
tation. If you use your car in the move, 
you may deduct actual gas and oil costs 
or mileage at nine cents a mile.

Moving can be very expensive. It is a 
gcod idea to keep track of all costs of 
your move with cancelled checks, receipts 
and other verifications so that those ex­

penses  that are deductible can be used to 
reduce your tax liability when your return 
is filed. Consult your tax advisor for a s - ' 
sistance in this area.

SHURFRESH
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PORK-N-BEANS
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C0MED FOOD SFESttl OF THE WEEK!

H A M  A  CHEESE SANDW ICH

$ 1M
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