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Despite some blustry 
weather, the Fourth of July 
in Muleshoe drew Urge 
crowdes again this year.

In the Pony Express 
Race, Gerld hanks was 
injured wh*n the horse 
that he was riding decided 
to buck and Shanks was 
thrown hitting the graveled 
side of the pavement. The 
race #as declared a draw*
with no awards being 
given.

Many flocked to the 
annual 4-H Omelet Rodeo 
after the race to enjoy the 
food prepared by Bailey 
County 4-H Council and 
members.

From the omelet rodeo, 
pleasure seekers could tra­
vel a two-way street-one to 
the Muleshoe pitching con­
test and the other to the 
Muleshoe Ex’es reunion 
which gathered in approxi­
mately 300 ex-students.

Kid's Activities and 
other entertainment could 
be found at the Bailey

Around

• Muleshoe
Second session of swim­

ming lessons will begin 
July 13 at the City Pool For 
registration or information, 
call Shcdey Dunham a t 
272-3091, Eugene Porras at 
272-3740 or Benton Glaze 
at 272-4743.

County Civic Center. Top 
county officials could be 
seen on the dunkin board 
and many townspeople 
turned out to take their 
turn at dousing their favo­
rite person.

The Old Settler’s reun­
ion saw approximately 200 
guests registered with the 
oldest being 94 yean 
young. Many old friend­
ships were renewed and a 
good time was had by all 
present.

At 5 p.m. the annual 
Freedom Parade was start- 
ted under skies which 
threatened to rain. The sun 
won out and spectators 
enjoyed the sights and 
sounds of the event.

The Fine Arts Boosters 
float, depicting the raising 
of the American Rag on 
Iwo Jima during World 
War II, received the first 
place award of $100 in 
cash. The first prize in the 
senior riding club division 
was presented to the Lamb 
County Sheriff’s t’osse, 
with the West Texas Raid­
ers of Lubbock placing sec­
ond. The Lubbock Rangers 
Junior Riding Gub placed 
first in the junior division.

To end the day, citizens 
chose the fireworks and 
picnic with entertainment 
by the Ratland Bluegrass 
or; the Muleshoe Junior 
Rodeo and the array "f 
riders there.
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ISS
Kim Farmer Captures Title

KIM FARMER

Sudan Celebrates 
Fourth Traditionally

Amid sounds of the 
brass choir, in the comer 
of the park, playing 

^A m erica,” chii<|ren 
shouting ctieeriT during 
human croquet and whin- 
neys from a young horse

Rex Black, president of 
the Muleshoe Roping Gub 
crowned Kim Farmer 
"Miss Rodeo Muleshoe 
1981”  at the first perfor­
mance of their annual July 
Junior Rodeo.

Kim is the 16 year old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Farmer of Muk- 
shoe and lists horse train­
ing and riding among her 
favorite sports. She also 
enjoys horse judging and 
has done well in both 
showing and judging. Kim 
plans to attend Texas Tech 
and major in horse scien­
ces.

At the beginning cere­
mony of the rodeo, Miss 
Farmer was presented with 
a bouquet of red roses, an 
engraved belt buckle and 
her crown. She will repre­
sent the roping club in all 
events for the period of one 
year. Kim was sponsored 
by Thornton Chevrolet.

The Miss Rodeo Mule­
shoe contest was the fist 
one of its kind held in this 
area in many years. The 
girls were judged early 
Friday morning on horse­
manship and knowledge 
and then in a personal

interview. A salad lunch­
eon prepared by the wives 
was enjoyed by the girls 
and their mothers. Poise, 
horsemanship, knowledge 
and intelligence were a few 
of the things counted in the 
overall scoring.

The judges for the event 
were Mac McCarty of 
Earth, Matt Howell of 
Dimmitt and Mrs. Wilma 
Fulgham of Govis. Mrs. 
Fulgham was the "Miss 
Rodeo Muleshoe of 1950” .

"Brenda Flowers was sel­
ected as 1st runner up. Her 
sponsor was Rowers Auc­
tion. She is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Row­
ers. She received a gift 
certificate.

Kellie Overman was 
named second runner up in 
the contest. She is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.

Burl Overman and her 
sponsor was Photography 
by Lonnie. Kellie also re­
ceived a gift certificate.

Other girls who partici­

pated in the contest were 
Starla Black, Delia Shaw, 
and Tamara Gilliland.

Sponsors and merchants 
who contributed to the ro­
deo contest were Riverside 
Chemical, Poynor’s
Whites, Johnny St. Clair, 
XIT Restaurant, Cashway 
Grocery, The Fair Store, 
Dent-Rempe. Adrian Pho­
tography, Western Drug,

Morrison Oil Watson Al­
falfa, Barry and Young, 
Main Street Beauty Shop, 
Lee’s Western Wear, KL’s 
Steakhouse, Gulf Whole­
sale, Sam’s Sporting 
Goods, Leal’s Restaurant 
and the Corral Restaurant.

As Miss Rodeo Mule­
shoe, Kim will be elegible 
to go on to competition in 
the Miss Teen Rodeo Tex­
as contest which will be 
held in 1981 at the San 
Antonio Livestock Exposi­
tion.

Officers and members of 
the Roping Gub deemed 
the contest a success and
plan to continue this event 
in the future.

Rain, Hail, Wind Batters County July 4

tied to a post; friends, 
relatives and pioneers ga­
thered in the Sudan park 
for a day of celebiation ana _  
togetherness. v l A i d l C a t i o n

Juiy 4th was explosive in 
more than one way this 
year. Late Saturday eve­
ning wind, sand, rain and 
hail swept southern Sailey 
County destroying up to 
800 acres of cotton near 
the Goodland-Three Way 
Communities. Estimates of 
damages were being 
checked out by ASCS and 
County Agents offices. A

Church Has

tornado reportedly touched 
ground near the small 
community of Goodland, 
causing damage to out­
buildings and power lines. 
One car was reported 
damaged. One resident 
described the storm as "a 
big sheet of rain and 
sand.”

Although some damage 
was sustained, the rainfall 
over the county in general

Wesley United Metho­
dist Church of Hereford, 
Texas is hosting “ Wesley’s 
Fall Festival Of Arts And 
Crafts” on Saturday, Sep­
tember 12.

The show will be held in 
the Hereford Community 
Center from 9 a.m. until 8 
p.m. Only a limited num­
ber of booths are available 
with applications being 
screened.

All area artists are urged 
to apply. For further in­
formation write Mrs. Gail 
Blain, Box 164, Hereford, 
Texas 79045.

Visiting in the home of 
Mrs. Glenda Morris this 
week are her daughter and 
her family, Lt. and Mrs. 
Mike Kiggins and Michael 
and Michele of Rapid City, 
South Dakota.

• • • • •
"DUNKIN DOWI/TS?”—No-just your friendly patrolman, 

lyndon Huckaby. Aiding and abetting the action is County 
Agent Spencer Tankslev.

FIRST PLACE RUNNERS— In the 10,000 meter race, the first place winners were Bennie 
Picked, Aldo Almanza, Tony Luna, Poyner Carala, Ricki Kelley, Lou Ann Nesbitt Shea 
Picked and Jeff Simmons.

A town tradition since 
July of 1976, the Sudan 
celebration has grown to 
be a yearly highlight in­
cluding activities for 
everyone.

Sudan pioneers received 
special recognition and the 
Sudan Hotel, which is be­
ing restored, was open for 
exhibition. Members of the 
community have put many 
hours of bolunteer work 
into the hotel.

Although an early rain 
dampened the festivities, 
the moisture was wel­
comed and activities 
moved inside.

It was not long before 
the sun and the people 
came out and activities 
continued with live enter­
tainment prfwided by local 
entertainers including 
“ Last of Its Kind” and 
other bands and vocalists.

Local organizations pro­
vided the food energy with 
hamburgers, homemade 
ice cream, drinks and other 
booths. Results of the pop­
ular Young Homemakers' 
booth were seen every­
where. The group painted 
designs such as Snoopy, 
sunshines and hearts on 
arms and legs.

The afternoon parade 
included the Sudan band, 
local dignitaries, children 
on decorated bikes, an­
tiques cars, riding clubs 
and of course the old red 
fire engine.

The Lamb County 
Sheriff s Posse received 
the first place trophy for 
riding clubs and the West 
Texas Rangers received 
second place.

In the float competition, 
the Jr. High Cheerleaders 
won first place for the 
theme "American For Me, 
Because 1 Can Be What I 
Wanna Be.” Second was 
the Little League float and 
third was the High School 
Cheerleaders.
< Awards and ribbons 

were also given to all the 
children who rode decora- 
Cont. Page 8, Col. 1

The New Covenant 
Church is having a church 
convention beginning 
Wednesday, July 8th 
through Sunday, July 12th.

Services are scheduled 
at 11:30 a.m. and 7:30 
p.m. Rev. Frank Hammond 
of Plainview will be speak­
ing on the family at noon 
each day. A meal will also 
be served.

Other speakers include 
Cont. Page 8, Col. 1

The Muleshoe Eagles 
captured first place in the 
a Jr. Babe Ruth League 
followed by the Colts who 
were second, Springlake- 
Earth, third and Lazbuddie 
and the Cats tied for 
fourth.

Seventeen area youths 
are competing in the 13 
year old All Star Tourna­
ment in Plainview July 6-8. 
Others attending will be 
Mike Bland of Muleshoe, 
manager; Phil Brockman of 
Lazbuddie, coach; and Ro­
land Perez of Muleshoe, 
coach.

Players attending and 
the teams they represent 
include: Sean Shipman and 
Gig Pierce of the Eagles; 
Cary Dayton, Jeff Mitchell 
and Danny Randolph of 
Springlake-Earth; and Alan 
Faulkner, Manuel Daniel, 
Steve Griswold, Joel Soto, 
and Jeff Vinson, alternate 
of the Colts.

Also competing will be 
Jay Reyas, Adren Perez 
and Sidney Lewis of the 
Cats; Paul Gonzales, Guy 
Btockman, David Schacher 
and Scotty Coker, alternate 
of Lazbuddie.

RIDER INJURED—The annual Pony Express race was 
called a draw due to a Muleshoe riders’ injuries. The 
injured rider was Gerald Shanks.

Grain Producers 
Express Decision

Following the June 29 
kickoff meeting in Mule­
shoe, the Grain Sorghum 
Producers Association is 
continuing its area meet­
ings in Dumas and Rain- 
view to solicit support for 
their cause.

Believing that the Com­
modity Credit Corpora­
tion’s sale of imported 
grain in the High Rains is 
“ unjust, damaging and il­
legal”  farmers, elevator 
managers and bankers are 
taking their case to court.

The GSPA is ready to 
file a lawsuit in their behalf 
if sufficient funds can be 
raised. GSPA has been 
joined by Texas C**.* 

‘Growers, Texas WIFE, 
Texas Farmers Union and 
members of all area farm 
organizations.

North Rains elevators 
a rt sponsoring a luncheon 
in Dumas, July 8, in the 
Community Building. The

luncheon is free.
Farmers in the Eastern 

, iigh Plains area will meet 
m Plainview, July 9, at 8 
p.m. in the Hale County 
State Bank Meeting Room.

July 10 has been set as 
the deadline for raising the 
legal fund. It is estimated 
that the CCC sales will cost 
a million-pound producer 
at least $5,000 in lost 
market prices. GSPA Exe­
cutive Director Elbert Harp 
stated, " I am now con­
vinced that we will raise 
the money if the farmers 
and elevators continue 
their interest.

For events of the 
Fourth of July other 
than the rain and wind, 

the inside pages of 
the Journal for a picture 
story of “ July 4 - Mules 
Style.” ______

was very beneficial to the 
dryland cotton, according 
to County Agent Spencer 
Tanksley. From one to IVi 
inches of rain was reported 
around Maple and Need- 
more. Baileyboro received 
approximately one to two 
inches and the West Camp 
area reported heavy rains 
and washed-out roads in 
that area. Eastern Bailey 
County also received some 
good rain with amounts 
varying from one to two 
inches.

The City of Muleshoe 
proper received rain 
around 5 p.m. as well as 
later in the evening. Par­
ade contestants and con­
test entries were delayed 
in the onslaught of the rain 
and wind.

Rotary 
To Sponsor 
Wrestling

Muleshoe Rotary Gub 
met Tuesday at the Civic 
Center. The program was 
given by Bailey County 
Judge Glen Williams on 
the problems of re- 
districting.

The Rotary will be spon­
soring wrestling on July 23 
at 8:30 p.m. through the 
National Wrestling
Alliance.

The main even will fea­
ture Kevin von Erich vs 
Kubuki managed by Gary 
Hart.

Texas Tag Team Cham­
pionship will also be fea­
tured with the "Spoiler” 
and Alberto Madril vs Mr. 
Chan and Ten Gu.

Other bouts scheduled 
for this night are Brian 
Blair vs Raul Zapata and 
Jessie Barr vs Brian Adi­
das.

Ringside seats will be
Cont. Page 8, Col. 1

Tennis Tourney 
July 11

The Muieshoe Tennis 
Association reminds us a- 
bout thier weekend tour­
nament set to begin July 
11.

Deadline for men's 
doubles and women's 
doubles is Thursday, July 
9, at 4 p.m. Entry fee is $2 
and one can of tennis balls.
A partner is not necessary, 
pairings will be made.

Entries should be turned 
into Sherry Embry at the 
First National Bank.

Brackets will be posted 
at both courts and FNB.
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Thelma Laux 
Services Held 
Here Tuesday

Funeral services for 
Thelma Lauz, 76, of Los 
Alamos, N.M. were held at 
2 p.m. Tuesday in the Ellis 
Chapel of the Chimes with 
Rev. Dudley Bristow, pas­
tor of the Farwell First 
Baptist Church officiating.

Hardage Services 
Held Sunday

Services for Lacy M. 
Hardage, 78, were held at 
2:30 p.m. Sunday in the 
First Baptist Church with 
Rev. J.E. Meeks, pastor, 
officiating assisted by Rev. 
J.J. Terry of Bovina.

Burial was in the Okla­
homa Lane Cemetery un­
der the direction of Ellis 
Funeral Home. Hardage 
died at 5:30 p.m. July 3 in 
the Farwell Convalescent 
Home.

He was bom October 16, 
1902 in Arkadelphia, Ar­
kansas and married the 
former Bertha Britton Sep­
tember 3, 1922 in Seymore, 
Texas. He had lived in the 
Muleshoe area for 50 years 
moving here from Sey­
more. He was a farmer and 
a member of the Muleshoe 
First Baptist Church.

Survivors include his 
wife, Bertha; two sons, 
Wayne of Vernon and Billy 
of Plainview; one daugh­
ter, Mrs. Dortha Mason of 
Govis; four sisters, Mrs. 
Fairy Stovall and Mrs. Lela 
Doublas of Farwell, Mrs. 
Fraincis Billinbsley of Tex- 
ico, and Mrs. Lucille 
Smaltz of Vernon; three 
brothers, Walter of Lub­
bock, Will of Farwell and 
Ed of Texico; six grand­
children; and three great 
grandchildren.

Interment was in the 
Bailey County Memorial 
Park under the direction of 
Ellis Funeral Home. Mrs. 
Laux died at 5:10 p.m. July 
3 in the Los Alamos Medi­
cal Center.

She was bom June 25, 
1905 in Cameron, Okla­
homa. A former Muleshoe 
resident, Mrs. Laux moved 
to Los Alamos in 1977.

Survivors include one

LACY M. HARDAGE 
■W W'W <m WO w v v l

West Plains 
Medical Center 

' Report
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ADMITTED
July 2, Nellie Connell, 
Connie Johnson, Veta Self, 
Sefemo Aguirre, Jr.. Tina 
Galavon
July 3, Nicha Shaw, Shelly 
Smith, Harold Cowan, Ru­
by Wilson
July 4, Gerald Shanks, 
O.P. Brinker, Maryanne 
Smith
July 5, Elva Kemell, Mary 
Ruvalcaba, l.L. Kitchens 
July 6, Nancy Cochran, 
Norene Moore. Parlee
Tamplin, Annie Floyd,
Dewey McIntosh 
July 7, Margaret Quarles, 
Dawn Williams, Willie
Steinbock

DISMISSED
July 2, Jeremy Estroca, 
Lurjane Tiller 
July 3, Nita Griffiths, 
Trisha Burgess, Jewell
Tipton, LaJean Williams, 
Kathryn Hancock, Juston 
Black, Simona Castillo 
July 4, Stephen Cole, Elo- 
dia Madrigal, Micah Shaw, 
Shelly Smith Tena Galavan 
Frank Butler, Janie Gon­
zales
July 5, Gerald Shanks 
July 6, Maryanne Smith 
and baby girl, Thurman 
Bartlett, l.L. Kitchens, 
Feliberta DeLeon. Vet* 
Self, Elva Kemell 
July 7, Dewey McIntosh, 
Nellie Connell

son, Jimmy of Los Alamos; 
one sister, Mrs. Helen 
Keeney of Lawton, Okla­
homa; one brother, Tom 
Abrams of Nebraska; and 
one grandchild.

COURT RULES
The Supreme Court re­

cently restricted the ability of 
Americari towns and cities to 
use their zoning powers to 
keep nude dancing and other 
forms of sexually explicit 
entertainment from their 
commercial areas.

Vegetable Consumption Changing
Along with weather, in­

sects and other problems, 
farmers must also consider 
consumer demand. That’s 
certainly the case with 
vegetables.

“ It’s important for far­
mers to keep up with the 
ever-changing trends in 
consumption of individual 
vegetables," says Tom

Longbrake, horticulturist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, Texas 
A&M University System.

Of the total amount of 
vegetables purchased from 
1977-1979, 45.5 percent 
were fresh, 44.8 percent 
canned and 9.7 percent 
frozen, Longbrake ex­
plains. This compares to

the 1947-1949 average of 
60.3 percent fresh, 36.4 
percent canned and 3.3
percent frozen.

The average American 
consumed 226 pounds of 
vegetables per year in 
1977-1979, up from 198 
pounds in 1947-1949, 
Longbrake says.

<«n increase in consump­

tion of certain vegetables is 
balanced by a decrease in 
others.

However. watermelon 
consumption has decline 
26 percent since 
Longbrake notes, 
cantaloupe consumption 
has dropped 10 percent.

“ Despite a decrease in 
per capita consumption of 
some vegetables, overall 
production has remained

1940,
while

generally steady due to 
population growth,” notes 
the horticulturist.

REAGAN A SUMMIT
After insisting that Fidel 

C astro  be excluded, 
President Reagan accepted 
the invitation of Mexican 
President Jose Lopez Portillo 
to a summit conference of 
industria l and developing 
nations.
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Sugar: A 
Not-So-Sweet 
Situation

For some 8,000 years, 
sugar has been man’s pri­
mary sweetener. Since the 
start of the 20th century 
though, it has become in­
creasingly recognized for 
its preserving characteris­
tics -  a significant fact 
since two-thirds of the su­
gar Americans consume is 
in processed foods.

But what few Americans 
realize is that preserving 
domestic sugar supplies 
may be a not-so-sweet sit- 

\  uation in the very near 
|  future.

Today, most Americans 
know little about the im­
portant role sugar plays as 
a preservative. The dra­
matic changes in American 
lifestyle, including the ad­
vent of the working woman 
over the past few decades,

I has all bu eliminated time 
of families to prepare food. 
Subsequently, today’s con­
sumers rely increasingly on 
products that require little 
in the way of preparation 
and/or preservation.

Nowhere is that more 
evident than in canned 
vegetables, for example. 
Sugar maintains the body,

Earthtones 
Suggest 
Top Security

roqad the ciockj# .protect 
verything underneath.

Looking for insight into 
someone’s personality? 
Take a look at the colors he 
or she favors at home, ad­
vise psychology experts.

Purple, for example, is 
said to indicate wit, charm 
and eccentricity. Soft pastel 
shades, on the other hand, 
suggest calm and cheerful­
ness. Green is soothing.

Brown is earthy and ere 
ates a feeling of security. 
That makes it a popular 
color for exterior decorat­
ing. It is ideal for your roof, 
since the roof is the part of 
the house that works 

^#ro 
evi

Earthtones Popular
Increasingly popular as 

roofing colors these days, 
notes the Asphalt Roofing 
Manufacturers Association, 
arc the earthtone 'hades of 
three-dimensional asphalt 
sh ingles. Among the eye-ap- 
pcaling shades are hand- 
seme browns and beiges 
that help relate a home to 
its environment while add­
ing rugged and attractive 
shadow lines.

These long-lasting, low- 
maintenance shingles can 
also be used to blend with 
other exterior color ele­
ments of a home.

Color experts advise that 
the exterior of a home 
should have no more than 
three basic colors: one for 
the roof, one for the siding 
end one for the trim.
N'llrshoe Journal *>-*0)
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plumpness and overall 
physical state of the food. 
On fruits, sugar acts as a
protective coat, preventing 
browness and dryness 
caused by exposure to air.

In jams, jellies, pre­
serves and fruit butters, 
sugar deters the growth of 
harmful bacteria. Small a- 
mounts of the sweetener 
added to salt help stabilize 
iodine which is added to 
prevent goiter. In many 
other processed foods, su­
gar assists in color de­
velopment, moisture re­
tention and luster The fact 
is that sugar does play a 
crucial role in enabling 
Americans to choose from 
a variety of preserved, 
canned, frozen and pre­
pared foods.

Unfortunately, though, 
not all the sugar Ameri­
cans consume is produced 
domestically. Today, US 
growers account for over 
half of the domestic sugar 
supplies; the remainder is 
imported from GEPLACEA i 
an international sugar car­
tel comprised of 22 Latin 
American and Caribbean 
sugar exporting countries.

By manipulating the su­
gar market, these countries 

> could wipe out the domes­
tic industry, making us 
reliant on them for sugar. 
Such action has already 
resulted in more buying 
abroad and a subsequent 
decline in domestic pro­
duction. If this situration 
continues, it could result in 
the demise of a domestic 
industry and subsequent 
total* dependence on 
GAPLACEA.

The answer to this not- 
so-sweet situation may ex­
ist in the proposed Farm 
Bill; it calls for a US policy 
to assure domestic supplies 
while averting an OPEC 
situation. Considering the 
extensive use of sugar in 
the American food system, 
such legislation is impera­
tive. Otherwise, Americans 
may find themselves in 
another OPgtg-ttke «—■
tion, this time controlling 
sugar.

Kids Day Activities 
Winners Announced

Everyone had a great 
time during the Kid’s Day 
activities sponsored by 
Alpha Zeta Pi Sorority July 
4. Committee chairmen for 
the event were Betty Bush, 
Alice Liles, and Marilyn 
Saylor.

Results of the bike race 
include: 1st, Lonnie Bush; 
2nd, Jason McClannahan; 
3rd, Michael Bullock; and 
4th Tres Treadwell.

In the bike race for 8-9 
year olds 1st was Paul 
Williams; 2nd, Misty Du­
pler; 3rd, Lee Parmer; and 
4th Kirk Jesko.

In the 10-12 year old 
bike race, 1st was Michael 
Angeley; 2nd, Mike Du- 
pler; 3rd, Russell Brown; 
and 4th Michael Dunham.

Winners in the shoe race 
for the 5-6 _year olds were 
1st, Jason McClannahan; 
2nd, Tres Treadwell; 3rd, 
Rhonda Scott; and 4th 
John Miller.

In the 7-8 year olds shoe 
race, 1st was Kirk Jesko; 
2nd, Jeff McGuire; and

3rd, Reagan.
Shoe race winners in the 

9-12 year old division were: 
1st, Michael Dupler; 2nd 
Kristine Miller; and 3rd 
Terry Snell.

In the tire race compe­
tition for 6-7 year olds 1st 
was Kirk Jesko; 2nd Heath

(8-9 year olds) include: 1st, 
Heath Scott; 2nd, Kirk 
Jesko; and 3rd Heather
Hutton.

In the 10-12 year olds 
sack race 1st was Scott 
Miller; 2nd Michael Du­
pler; and 3rd, Domenic 
Modica.

Adult sack race winners 
were 1st, Ronald Scott; 
2nd, Gary Pope; and 3rd, 
Dee Treadwell.

In the smallest bike

gomery.
In the tricycle race (3-5 

year olds - first race) 1st 
was Todd Shipman; 2nd 
Justin Dupler; and 3rd, 
Jason Brandon.

In the second tricycle 
race (3-5 year olds) there 
was a tie for first, Nicky 
Chad and Jessica Burch; 
2nd, Tonda Deann Magby; 
and 3rd, Courtney.

(26

2nd, Casey Dupler; ->nd 
3rd, Holly; (6-8 year olds) 
1st, Kirk Jesko; 2nd, Misty 
Dupler; and 3rd. Jason 
McClannahan; (10-12 year 
olds) 1st, Scott Miller; 2nd, 
Michael Dupler; and 3rd 
Michael Dunham.

In the balloon break (3-5 
year olds) 1st was Leslee 
TreadweU; 2nd, Casey Du­
pler; and 3rd, Russell Mc­
Guire.

Scott; and 3rd, Amy Lou 
Allen. competition (4-5 year olds)

Tire race winners in the 
8-9 year olds include: 1st, 
Jason McClannahan; 2nd, 
Melinda Turney; and a tie 
for 3rd, Casey Dupler and 
Koby Abney.

In the tire race for 10-12 
year olds 1st was Micheal 
Dupler; 2nd Scott Miller; 
and 3rd, Kristine Miller.

Jason McClannhan was 
first in the sack race (6-7 
year olds) followed by Ko­
by Abney; 3rd, Amy Lou 
Allen; and 4th Tres Tread­
well.

In the sack race for 4-5 
year old, 1st was Casey 
Dupler; 2nd, John Miller; 
and 3rd, Jodi Cole.

Winners in the sack race

1st was John Miller; 2nd, 
Jeffery Pope; and there 
was a tie for third: Casey 
Dupler and Chad Mont-

Hot Wheels winners 
year olds) were 1st, Bran- Balloon break winners in 
don Bush; 2nd, Leslee the 6-7 year division were 
Treadwell; and 3rd, Guy 1st, Amy Loy Allen: nd, 
Wayne N<chols. Koby Abney; and 3rd,

Potatoe race winners in- Darrell McCamish
dude: 1st, John Miller; Also in

r f . I

Public Notice
Southwestern Bell, in accordance with 

the rules of the Public Utility Commission of 
Texas, hereby gives notice of the com­
pany's intent to implement a new schedule 
of telephone rates in Texas effective July 21, 
1981, unless otherwise determined by the 
Commission.

It is expected that the requested rate 
schedule w ill furnish a 15.8 percent 
increase in the com pany's intrastate  
revenues.

A complete copy of the new rate sched­
ule is on file with the Public Utility Commis­
sion at Austin, Texas, and with each 
affected municipality served by Southwest­
ern Bell, and is available for inspection in 
each of the company's public business 
offices in Texas.

Notice to Customers of 
O ther Telephone Com panies

The filing includes, but is not limited 
to, proposals to increase rates for in­
terexchange private line and foreign 
exchange (FX) service. Changes in 
such rates would also affect customers 
of other telephone companies be­
cause such companies provide in­
terexchange private line and foreign 
exchange service in accordance 
with rates specified in Southwestern 
Bell’s tariffs.

the 10-12 year

old division of the balioon 
break, 1st was Scott Miller; 
2nd, Michael Dunham; and 
3rd, Michael Johnson.

In the egg race winners 
in the up to 5 years old 
division were 1st, Shane 
Terrell; 2nd, John Miller; 
and 3rd, Casey Dupler.

Winners in the egg race 
for 6-8 year olds were 1st, 
Kirk Jesko; 2nd, Koby Ab- 
ney; and 3rd, Heather 
Hutton.

In the egg race for 9-12 
year olds winners were 1st, 
Dean Bara; 2nd, Scott Mil­
ler; and 3rd, Melinda 
Turney.

Aviso Publico
Southwestern Bell, en conformidad a las 

reglas de1 Public Utility Commission (Comi- 
sidn de Oervicios Pub!:ccs) de Texas, por la 
presente hace saber su intencidn de estab- 
lecer un nuevo arancel para servicio de 
tetefono en Texas con vigencia a partir del 
21 de Julio de 1981, a menos que la Comi- 
si6n haga otra determinacidn.

Se espera que el nuevo arancel que se 
ha solicitado rendird un aumento de 15.8 
por ciento en los ingresos intraestatales de 
la comparti'a

Una copia completa del nuevo arancel se 
ha archivado en las oficinas del Public Utility 
Commission en Austin, Texas, al igual que 
en cada nunidpalidad afectada y servida 
por Southwestern Bell, y cada una de las 
oficinas de la compahia oara i legodos con 
el publico en Texas tiene una copia para 
lectura publica.

Aviso a  los C lientes de  
O tras C om panias de  Telefono
El registro incluye pero no se limita 

a, proouestas para aumentar las tari- 
fas oara servicio de tinea privada entre 
centrales telefdnicas (interexchange 
private line) y servicio de central tele- 
fdnica extranjera (foreign exchange 
FX). Cambios en dichas larifas de 
servicio tambier. afectarian a clien- 
tes de otras compartias de tetefono 
porque dichas compainas prnveen 
los servicios ya m encionados en 
conformidad a tarifas especificadas 
por Southwestern Bell

RESIDENTS COOK OVT.....A  cookout for the Nursing 
Home residents w ts held July, 3‘ at the Muleshorf Nursltig' 
Home. Hamburgers and all the trimmings were served. 
Pictured are some of the residents and nursing home staff.

Afc Jpt R ! Southwestern Bell

M
m

r j  s f t*  

r  ' * A 5M
fmm u i  naaoi am*

i — r
STOW WWW

7 JO • 5 30

Summer Tire Sale
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Cordovan All Season
STEEL BELTED 
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B o n n  B e n n e t t  B o o k k e e p e r

S U B S C R IP T I O N S

M r !1 t b o r  J o u r n a l  a n d  B ru te y  C o u n ty
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DRINKS ANYONE?.....These employees of the Muleshoe 
Hospital and Nursing Home helped the residents of the 
Nursing Home with a cook out Friday, July 3.

Creative 
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Shop Rite
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SALE
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1 Two super strong belts o t steel cord 
under the treed provide bruise resistance 
•n d  stab ility  to r long wear

2 Radial body plies o< polyester cord give a 
sm ooth ride w ith  tlex itiH ty  and strength in 
the sidewalls, and help to save gas

3 Aggressive tread design w ith  thousands ol 
D'tmg edges to r good traction on both wet 
and dry pavement

a H i-T raction tread rubber com pound 
flexib le  at temperatures below Ireeamg to 
m aintain good traction

5 Special tread design contribu tes to  low 
notse level w hile  provid ing great g ripp ing  
action

6 Tapered shoulder design w ith  deep 
grooves produces good traction on curves 
and hilts

7 New P-Seriea sues tor tov. p ro ti'e  
appearance end excellent d iv in g  
perform ance

Stock No ASCII
Silt P14S-OOR13 

Regular 4382

|
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Water lo a  ia greater dur 
ing h o t  weather becam e 
your body perapirea more 
th a n  usual in an effort to 
k eep  c o o l. Maintaining a 
proper water balance will 
help regulate your body* 
te m p e ra tu re  and prevent 
overheating.

from tapers which had 
been lighted by their 
mothers at the beginning 
of the ceremony.

Traditional wedding mu­
sic was rendered by or­
ganist Betty Hausman. 
Special selections of “ The 
Wedding Song,” “ Always 
and Forever,“ and “ Color 
My World” were sung by 
Linda Chesnut. She was 
accompanied by Tena Lan­
ders at the piano.

For her daughter’s wed­
ding, Mrs. Wall chose a 
floor length gown of yellow 
featuring crystal pleated 
skirt. Mrs. Wimberly was 
attired in a gown of smoke 
gray knit.

Tina Collins registered 
guests at the reception in 
the church fellowship hall, 
Pam Young and Tonya 
Gartin served the tiered 
wedding cake and punch 
from a lace covered table. 
The wedding cake was de­
corated with love birds and 
roses. The centerpiece was 
a candelabra containing 
blue tapers and featured 
the bride’s bouquet. Crys­
tal and silver appointments 
were also used.

For a wedding trip to 
Dallas, the bride chose a 
white shirt dress, belted in 
blue with white accesso­
ries.

The couple are at home 
in Muleshoe where both 
are employed.

Richland Hills Baptist 
Church was the setting 
June 12 for the marriage of 
Tammy Wall to Lee Elder. 
Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Wall and 
Janies Elder and Mrs. W. 
F. Wimberley, all of Mule­
shoe.

Escorted by her father 
and given in marriage by 
both mother and father, 
Mrs. Elder was attired in a 
gown of silk organza, fea­
turing Queen Anne bodice, 
re-embroidered with crys­
tal beads. Flowing lace 
sleeves were caught at the 
wrist with satin bows. The 
skirt was swept into a lace 
bordered train in back 
which was caught on each 
side with satin bows. Her 
veil of lace bordered silk 
illusion fell from an organ­
za head band to waltz 
length. She carried a nose­
gay of assorted silk flowers 
in shades of blue, trimmed 
with white lace and blue 
streamers.

Connie Vaughn, sister of 
the bride, was matron of 
honor. Traci Walker and 
Jalayne Collins were 
bridesmaids. They wore i- 
dentical gowns of blue on 
white with sheer bodice 
over camisole tops and 
a-line skirts. The carried 
bouquets of blue silk 
flowers.

Curtis Elder, brother of 
the groom was best man. 
Groomsmen were Glen 
Green and Mark Bruns.

Rickey Wall, James At­
wood and Mik- Henry sea­
ted the guests.

Cassie Tunne, of Earth, 
was flower girl and David 
Vaughn, nephew of the 
bride, was ring bearer.

Stacy Elder end Candy 
Long lighted the altar can­
delabra which formed an 
arch, flanked by spiral 
candleabra bearing white 
tapers and entwined with 
silk greenery and flowers. 
White mums and foilage 
plants ringed the outer 
perimeter of the altar area.

Following the ceremony, 
which was performed by 
H.O. Huff, Jr., the coupl 
lighted their unity candle

'e m !-----T—=rr. -----
According to the Ameri­

can Bottled Water Aaaocia 
tion, water is especially jm. 
portant to your body when 
p lay in g  warmer weather 
sports During long periods 
of ex e rc ise , w a te r intake 
minimizes dehydration that 
can result from sweating It 
reduces stress on your cir­
c u la to ry  sy s te m , and it 
helps your blood carry ener 
gy providing carbonydrates 
to your body’s cells.

The average adult needs 
to drink at least eight cups 
of wa^er daily, more in hot 
w e a th e r , to  maintain the 
body’s proper water balance 
The body’* intake of water 
must equal the body's out­
put of water to ensure prop­
er water balance.

R em em b er as sum m er 
approaches, water is an im­
p o r ta n t  element in both 
work and play.

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED..... Mr. and Mrs. Robert
Meyer of Independence, Kansas announce the engage­
ment and approaching marriage of their daughter, Helen 
Meyer of Amarillo, to Bryan Travis of Muleshoe, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Richard L. Travis of Akron, Colorado. Miss 
Meyer is a medical Technologist at High Plains Baptist 
Hospital in Amarillo. Travis is plant engineer at the TOLK 
Station.
KTrrrrrrarr » nm »»»e a rnrn Trr* * a»*»i mm

I Announcing...
Ruth Locker 

\ I l l s  Back!
• Ruth Locker Is Now
§
• __
’ Associated With Ana’s Once
• Again ! She Is A Graduate
\ Of Jessie Lee’s And
• Specializes In Perms, Cuts &
| Blow Dries.
I Ruth Encourages All Her Old Customers |
I To Call Or Come By. •

! Ana ’s House of Beauty ;
e 104  E. Ave. B 272-4152 j

......... ..................................................................................................................................... .....
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MR. AND MRS. LEE ELDER [nee Tammy Wall\

O n  w t  IT t o o k  a  mam  
J fs  -DUM J -o

f*TR .A C t rue T39  eocrr of *
5 tC -P K . lT  N U « SM £  . H f W «5 Fe«M  THtN JM HUMW CtMTVng ■

Ruth Lockerstationed at F.E. Warren 
Air Force Base in Chey­
enne, Wyoming, where he 
was a Minute Man 111 
Missile Combat Crew 
Commander.

Captain Shafer has now 
bc^a assigend to Vinden- 
burg Air Force Base in 
California, for further work 
in the (Top Hand) Missile 
program.

He is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Shafer, and is 
married to the former 
Cassie Precure, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Precure, all of Muleshoe.

He is a 1972 graduate of 
Muleshoe High School and 
received a bachelors PWS 
degree from the University 
of Wyoming. Mrs. Shafer 
is a 1973 graduate of 
Muleshoe High School and 
a 1977 graduate of ENMU.

Larry Shafer Promoted
Captain

ing at the Aquadrcn Offi­
cer School at Maxwell Air 
Force Base in Montgom­
ery. Alabama, prior to this 
promotion.

Since graduation from 
the Academy, he has been

Larry Shafer, u 1977 
graduate of the US Air 
Force Academy, Colorado 
Springs, Colorado, was re­
cently promoted to Captain 
in the US Air Force.

He completed his train-

Going Out Of 
Business Sale Hobby Chib

The Muleshoe Hobby 
Gub met in regular session 
July 2, with 16 members 
present.

Those present were 
Virkey Hendricks, Mae 
Loyd, Myrtle Chambless, 
Verna Dement, Veta Self. 
Jo Wilson, Sammie Eth­
ridge, Ola Epperly, Ethel 
Julian, Allie Barbour, Vic 
Core, Myrtle Wells, Ber­
nice Amerson, Edith Fox, 
and Ercell Whitt.

Articles on display were 
jewelry box, large baby 
doll, vegetable (crewl) 
plaques, puppy love quilt, 
cobble stone rock from 
Brazil, penny weight scale 
for jewelry and antique

PriceEverything
In The 
Store

We Will Appear In Cos

Imagination Plus
800 W. American Blvd. 

Tradewinds Plaza
LARRY SHAFER fountain pen

Are you skeptical 
about so-called  

“MIRACLE DIETS”
..and NO-EFFORT 

WEIGHT LOSS PROGRAMS?

SO  ARE WE!
T h e  D ie t C e n te r  o ffers  a fast, 

safe, in exp en s ive  p ro g ram  
based on sound n u tr itio n .

In Every Department

Thursday, July 9

If  | 272 S187 \CENTER
For A Free Consultation
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BEST LOSER......Zeffa Shafer on left, was crowned best
loser for the past six months at the TOPS Gub meeting 
July 2. Mary Ann Ramirez was named first runner up. 
Mrs. Shafer received a gift from each of the members and 
all of the gainers fines (for last six months). Ms. Ramirez 
received a check from the club and a gift from Mrs.

Muleshoe TOPS Chapter 
TX # 34 met Thursday, 
July 2 in the Meeting 
Room of Bailey County 
Electric.

Clara Lou Jones, presi­
dent, called the meeting to 
order. The TOPS pledge 
was recited and the fel­
lowship song sang. Evelen 
Harris, weight recorder, 
called the roll with 28 
members answering with 
the numbe- of pounds they 
had lost or gained. Linda 
Vinson, secretary, read the 
minutes of the previous 
meeting.

Best loser for the week 
was Vickie Garner, first 
runner up was Jackie 
Whatley, Zeffa Shafer was 
second runner up.

Jenny Mitchell was 
crowned monthly best loser 
her runners cp were Zeffa 
Shafer, first and Jerri 
Serna, second. Dellie t)e 
Loach was named KOPS 
(Keep Off Pounds Senai-

Does it take a special 
"knack” to make prize- 
winning jam? “No ” say fair 
judges, who pick the winners. 
Daing I4U.V ripe, high fioaJifcfe. u  
fruit, a good recipe and resow­
ing procedures exactly are the 
secrets of b.ue-ribbon success 
anyone can copy.

For perfect jam that can win 
epproval from fair judges or 
your family, use this recipe for 
Spicsd Peach Jam and follow 
these tips:

— Use high quality pow­
dered fruit pectin. A recipe 
with powdered pectin elim­
inates guesswo'k and allows 
you to use fully-ripe fruits, for 
best flavor and color.

— Measure accurate!-,. Top 
quality results depend on ex­
act amounts of f<uit, pectin, 
acid and sugar.

— Use a large, flat-bottomed 
pan. so jam will cook quickly

and not boil over.
— Make only one batch at a 

time.
-  Time cooking exactly
— Stirring and skimming for 

n te-m invm  fu-tpi? «- trif5ui* -
fruit evenly in the syrup.

-  Check fair rule book for 
jar size. Most call for standard 
1/2-pint jars or glasses.
SPICED PEACH JAM
5 cups prepared peaches 

(about 4 lbs.)
2 tablespoons ler.ren juice 
1 tablespoon grated 

lemon peel
1 large cinnamon stick 
7 cups sugar 
1 pkg. Jel Ease/Pen-Jel 

Fruit Pectin
Wash and sterilize 8-oz. jelly 

jars; scald lids and rings.

Wash and pit fully ripe 
peaches; peel, cut into pieces

and grind. Measure fruit into 6 
to 8-quart saucepan; if 
necessary add water to make S 
cups. Add lemon juice, peel 
and jcinnqnyn^l^lL 
sugar into large bowl; set 
aside.

Combine pectin with fruit 
mixture. Cook over high heat 
until mixture comes to a hard 
boil, stirring constantly. Add 
sugar all at once. Cook and stir 
over high heat until mixture 
comes to a full rolling boil (one 
that cannot be stirred down). 
Boil hard 1 minute.

Remove from heat; skim and 
stir with metal spoon or skim­
mer for & minutes to remove 
foam. Remove cinnamon stick. 
Ladle into hot jars, leaving 
1/8-inch rim at top*. Im­
mediately wipe jar rim clean, 
place hot lid on jar and screw 
metal ring on firmly. Check for 
seal in 12 hours. 7 to 8 cups.

Final Markdown
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bly) queen.
The highlight of the 

meeting was the o w n in g  
of the six months b 'r i  
loser. Zeffa Shafer was the 
best loser for the six 
months. Runner rps were 
Mary Ann Ramirez, first; 
Jerri Serna, second; Josie 
Pedrosa and Vickie Garner 
tied for third; Laveme 
James, fourth; Thresia Da­
vis, fifth; Belinda Pedrosa, 
sixth; Jenny Mitchell, se­
venth; Wanda Kemp, 
eighth; and Evelene Harris 
was ninth.

One renewal member, 
Shonda Mitchell, was wel­
comed to the club.

The meeting was closed 
with the singing of the 
goodnight song.

T **»->- -f-aJL* .
*
TOP TEN LOSERS..... Back row (L-R) Zeffa Shafer, best loser; Mary Ann Rameriz, first
runner up; Jerri Serna, second; Vickie Gamer, Josie Pedrosa, third; Laveme James, fourth; 
Thresia Davis, fifth; seated; (L-R) Belinda Lopez, sixth; Jenny Mitchell, seventh; and 
Wanda Kemp, eighth. Not pictured, Evelene Harris, ninth.

How To Make Prize-Winning Jam

Unsey Michele Smith

Mr. and Mrs. Truitt 
Smith of Farwell are the 
proud parents of a daugh­
ter bom at 2:47 a.m. July 4 
in the West Plains Medical 
Center.

The young lady weighed 
seven pounds, 13 ounces 
and has been named 
Linsey Michele. She is the 
first child for the couple.

Grandparents are Lloyd 
Smith of Texico, Stella 
Smith of Farwell, Ted 
Knishera of Iowa and Sally 
Knishera of Govis.

Great grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Smith of 
Corsacana, Texas and 
Lennie Mae Crook of Far- 
well.

Alyssi Blair Saylor
* V ■» '-*-*• » ■>— 'NM

Mr. and Mrs. John 
Saylor are the proud 
parents ot a daughter bom 
June 24 at 9:37 a.m. in the 
Lubbock General Hospital. 
She weighed seven pounds 
and four ounces and has 
been named Alyssa Blair. 
She is the first child for the 

-couple.
'Grandparents are Mr. 

and Mrs. D.M. McGuire 
and Mr. and Mrs. C.L. 
Taylor all of Muleshoe.

Great grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Beaver 
of Farwell and Mrs. Audry 
McGuire of Shallowater.

Great great grand­
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
N.L. Saylor of Govis and 
G.E. Free of Earth.

Moderate fatigue ia not 
harmful to you or your 
work, ptychologut* say, but 
extreme fatigue ahould be 
avoided. Experiment* *how 
it takea three time* a* long 
to reat up from being overly 
tired a* from ordinary tired- 
neaa. Short re*t*, however, 
and relaxing with a refresh 
ment like a gla*a of iced tea 
can help keep you up to 
par.

C L I I B & X C I

I S i r u m n

ALLSUP’S 
ICE CREAM

Crisco Shortening

$ ]9 9

B-B-Qus Sauce

M iumno

Salt u

3 b. can

BUTTER
MILK

S h v rtra ik

Mustard
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RUFFLES
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F0L6ERS
COFFEE
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fidget*
coffee
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Weiners
. 12 oz. pkg.
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TRICES EFFECTIVE 
JULY 9-11.1881 

WHILE SUPPLY LISTS .
SHOP ION IID SME1 I CONVENIENCE STORES

OKI 24 HOURS* MY 
SSS DAYS I  YEAR 
HE RESERVE THE 
RlflHT TO LIMIT

"THERE’S ORE REAR YOU'

Shurfreth Longhorn Coby

Cheese TEXAS

10 oz.

3 oz. Shurfino 

I  oz.
Tomatol 

Sauce

J

POTATO
CHIPS

■ t. 11 Alaim cut
POTATO $109
CHIPS ’»

Fresh
Popcorn

If Not N.O.W . 
When?

V
If you haven't yet com bined your savings and checking  
accounts into a M uleshoe State Bank N .O .W . Account, 
you're losing in terest— fast!! The N O W. Account acts 
Ijke a regular checking account— there when you need it. 
O pen a N .O .W . A ccount-^now  and watch your interest 
grow!!

1 MULESHOE]
.1'STATE BANK , j

^  M em ber FDIC .,.2 7 2  -4561 J f t J

Strawberries

16 oz.

Fresh Cooked

Links

■ ‘ , 'V

1212. CMS

COCA-COLA

i n a

% j*., *• v ; ■-
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Rotary...
Cont. From Pa»e 1

$4.00 with general admis­
sion $3.00 and kids age 6 
to 12 $1.00.

Tickets may be obtained 
at the First National Bank 
or the Muleshoe State 
Bank.

Church...
Cont. From Page 1 
Calvin Cobb from Louisi­
ana and Dorman Dugan 
from The Community 
Church in Hereford.

A Dedication Service will 
be held Sunday morning 
for the new church build­
ing. The church is located 
three miles east of Mule­
shoe on Highway 70.

Sudan***
Cont. From Page 1

ted bicycles.
•In the window decorat­

ing contest. The Main 
Place was first, followed by 
Beller’s Higginbotham- 
Bartlett Co., and the First 
National Bank of Sudan.

Randy Pierce won the 
best groomed in the beard 
growing contest. Pete Ed­
wards had the longest and
Oscar Tomlinson had the »
Ugliest.

Girls

Softball

High Plains Aquifer Maps Available
-*• *  r t .  n c r;^  scientist said

THIRD PLACE WINNERS—Winning third place in the 
10,000 meter run were: Wesley Dupler, Dora Triana 
Peggy Gaynor and Lynn Todd.

Local Fireman 
To Attend School

The 1981 Texas Fire­
men’s Training School will 
be held at the Texas A&M 
University campus, July 
19-24. Texas Farm Gureau 
Insurance Companies and 
the Bailey County Farm 
Bureau will jointly sponsor 
one fireman to the school.

Alton Parker of Mule­
shoe, who is a volunteer 
fireman with the Muleshoe 
Volunteer Fire Department

AllStar Tourney 
Scheduled July 13

The 14-15 year old Babe 
Ruth All Star tournament 
will be held at the Mule­
shoe Jr. Babe Ruth Park 
beginning Monday, July 
13 at 8 p.m. with Muleshoe 
VS Dimmitt.

Coaches for the All Stars 
will be Gerry Pierce. 
Muleshoe and Ed Henley, 
Springlake-Earth. Gary 
Shipman of Muleshoe will 
be the manager.

Boys in the running and 
the teams they played with 
this year include John

Agee, Jay Gleason. Darren 
Shaw, and Trent Hysin^er 
of the Eagles and Joe 
Olveria, Jody Henley, and 
Manuel Monroe of Spring- 
lake-Earth.

Others who could also 
compete include Danny 
Schacher, Jeff Sandridge, 
Robert Topia and Jason 
Scoggins of Lazbuddie; 
Creg Hunt, Eddie Perez, 
Smiley Oroxco, Mark Mo- 
ton and Ray Vinson of the 
Colts and Hector Flores 
and David Vela of the Cats.

will study modem fire­
fighting techniques and di­
saster operations, along 
with fire prevention pro­
cedures at the school.

All firemen and fire 
marshals attending the an­
nual Firemen’s Training 
School will participate in 
several conferences con­
ducted by the Texas Farm 
Bureau insurance Compa­
nies. These include ‘‘Elec­
tric Shock Demonstra­
tion,”  by Joe Smetana, 
TFB safety director; and 
‘‘Preventing Rural Fires,” 
by Ward Cross, TFB In­
surance Cos. administra­
tive assistant. TFB Presi­
dent Carrol Chaloupka will 
speak on ‘‘Texas Farm 
Bureau’s Interest in Rural 
Fire Protection.”

Anewered In Full
The busybody was 

pumping the local doctor 
about the recent demise of 
the town’s richest man.

‘‘You knew him well,” 
she said and then coyly in­
quired: ‘‘How much of his 
wealth did he leave?”

With a tip of of his hat, 
the old doctor replied: “ All 
of it, madame, all of it.”

Leal’s captured the 
championship in the Mule­
shoe Softball League July 
4th Tourney with a 15-12 
win over the Mauraders.

Leal’s was the only team 
to complete the 3-2 tourney 
undefeated. The team 
worked its way to the 
championship by defeating 
the Stars and the Cudas.

The Mauraders were 
sent to the loser’s bracket 
by AVI who were later 
defeated by Leal’s. The 
Mauraders, who were se­
cond in the tourney, won 
three games in the losers’ 
bracket before losing to 
Leal's.

Western Sprinklers lost 
to the Mauraders, who are 
sponsored by Western 66 
for third place.

Maps showing irrigated 
cropland in 15 counties in 
eight states of the High 
Plains Aquifer region, 
stretching from South Da­
kota to New Mexico, have 
been prepared by the US 
Geological Survey, Depart­
ment of the Interior.

The maps are part of a 
five year project started in 
1978 by the USGS to de­
velop a ground water flow 
computer model of the 
Ogallala aquifer and asso­
ciated water bearing sedi­
ments that underlie about 
177,000 square miles of the 
High Plains region. Once 
developed, the model can 
be used to evaluate al­
ternative ground water
management methods and 
proposals in the region.

Ground water levels 
have been falling in most 
parts of the region since 
pumping for irrigation of 
farmlands began increas­

ing shortly after World 
War 11. ‘Most of the ir­
rigation water is being 
pumped from the Ogallala
aquifer.

‘‘The computer model 
will help state and local 
water managers to better 
evaluate how best to use 
and conserve the supplies 
of ground water in the 
High Plains region,”  said 
John B. Weeks, a USGS 
hydrologist in Denver, 
Colorado, who is coordina­
ting the High Plains re­
gional aquifei study.

The nine irrigated crop­
land mapst, showing 15 
counties, depict Cherry 
County, Neb.; Chase, 
Dundy, and Perkins Coun­
ties, Neb.; Todd County, 
S.D.; Cheyenne and Sher­
man Counties, Kan.; Lar­
amie County, Wyo.; Kit 
Carson, Phillips and Yuma 
Counties, Colo.; Texas 
County, Okla.; Hockley 
ard Lamb Counties, Texas;

and Curry County, N.M.
In order to compelte the 

computer model simulating 
ground water flows in the 
aquifer, Weeks said the 
USGS first has to deter­
mine pumpage of ground 
water in the region. This is 
being documented through 
preparation of irrigated 
cropland maps.

The USGS scientist said 
the nine maps of the 15 
counties were prepared by 
the Survey’s Office of Ge­
ographic Research using 
Landsat Earth resources 
survey satellite images ta­
ken in 1978. Landsat im­
ages taken in 1980 will be 
used to prepare an irri­
gated cropland map of the 
entire High Plains region.

Let's chat about the Florida Keys.
• The Keys" is a 4000-square m;!e 

area of shallow water and islands 
stretching southwest of Miami for 
almost 150 miles. Much of this area 
is preserved as national parks, and 
virtually all of it offers superlative 
fishing at certain times of the year.

Within U S. waters, the Keys is 
the place to go to fish shallow water 
flats for suen species of fish as bo- 
nefish. tarpon, and permit. Here, 
flats fishing with a fly or spinning 
rod is a wel* developed science, and 
there are ample services and facili­
ties for the visiting angler.

Biscayne Bay, just south of Miami,
fir ’ * *

 ̂ Winters are a lot ntter in the Keys 
than they are elsewhere in this coun­
try but the fishing is not. For all 
species of fish mentioned above. 
March through August is the time

,0 How do you get there'* I recom­
mend hopping a Braniffjet to Miami 
and picking up a rental car This is 
the most practical way I know of to 
visit this area.

and permit, despite its proximity to 
a large metropolitan area. Although 
a lot of people live here, senous fisn-

Frankly, the scientists 
are getting ahead of the 
popular imagination.

*  • *  *

Can you remember the 
good old days when a 
man’s word was his bond? 

* • * *
The problems of agri­

culture cannot be success­
fully settled by confer­
ences around a desk.

SECOND PLACE-P a te l  
Josie Perez and Irene Jones

Samarron, Henry Samarron. Martin Mendoza, Jack Tarver, 
were all second place winners in the Jaycee sponsored run.

ing competition is not a problem.
Islamorada is the place where 1 

have done the most fishing and is 
the center of the Keys' complex:
Here are numerous facilities for an­
glers, plenty of professional fishing 
guides, and a good supply of tarpon,
permit, and bonefish most of the 
year. During peak fishing periods,
Islamorada can be crowded, how­
ever.

Marathon lies 40 miles farther 
down the Keys Overseas highway 
and is also a center of civilization 
with marinas, hotels, restaurants, 
and fishing guides

Key West, the end of the Keys, 
is a historic little city, which offers 
charm in addition to facilities and 
services for the visiting angler. Bo­
nefishing is not as good here as it 
is up the line, but permit and tarpon 
fishing are excellent most of the

American Life & Accident 
f  \ 1 1 Insurance Company

Cash Burial Cancer N S C A Group 
Hospitalization Specialist in the 100°7°
Life Insurance Medicare Supplement

Robert Wilson
, , Branch Office
Local

„  n, #7 Briercroft Ofc. Park
Î Box 431 Phone 2/2-4069 Sujte 110Phone g06 765-8985 

Muleshoe. Texas 79347 Lubbock> Texgs ^

Boot & Shoe 
Repair

6 1 7 E , A m e r .  B lv d .

Kingsford

Charcoal
Reg $r . $ ]9 9

Toys
20% OFF

Hours Sunday 1-6 PM 
M onddy-Saturday 10-7 pm

QUITTING
BUSINESS

Guns & Ammo
2 0 %  off
Final Markdown

Radios & Stereos
20% OFF

4

Watches

Sales

All While Last! No Rainchecks

l  Calculators

20%  0FF
5 oi. Bar ...A  *  m

Reg - 5 6 < .. - * J  Bars >  1

While Supply Lasts

00

Wrangler
Big Bell Jeans 

^  Pair $20
A

O

(00
Maxwell House

Coffee
$009

V

Record & Tap 
2 0 %  c

Final Markdown

les
IFF

Lawn Mowe
22" cut 3.59- HP B & S E

$10495
‘ 20" cut 3 HP

irs
ngine

Paint & Supplies
D I . . . L L . .  C____ I! '  - IPlumbing Supplies

30% 0FF
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STATE BOUND..... Kristi Spies and her horse "Junior” are ready to travel to the State 4-H
Horse Show. Kristi qualified for this by winning the Reining event at the District 2 Show.

DISTRICT QUALIFIER..... Brenda Flowers placed 10th in Western Pleasure at the July 2
in f iiKKnrV

WACO-HERE WE COME..... Kim Farmer and her 2 year old gelding "Hot Shot” are 
"raring” to go. Kim won her halter class and placed fourth in Pleasure at District. She is 
also entered in the State Western Pleasure Futurity.

"  VVm r KI 1  BARGAIN I  tool value
V IM  I. ■  0F THE m onth  ■  OF THE MONTH

u i  m i  > m \ i u  m  ■

r m ----------------------
custom tccissomis. me

DELUXE 
HEAVY-DUTY 
FOOT PUMP
Delivers 100 psi for filling 
tires, balls, air manresses, 
rafts, inner tubes and 
morel With gauge. 26- 
in. hoae. 57770

QUANTITIES UWTED

30-dT. STEP-ON 
WASTEBASKET
Step on the pedal to make 
the lid pop open Uaes a 
paper grocery bag as a 
liner. Assorted colors 
with white lid. 2856-60

GRIP-IT
New
Concept 
in Tools

6-IN. STRAP 
WRENCH
The Grip-lt strap wrench 
handles any shape— with 
a soft touch I Works on 
filters, plsstic pipe. etc. 
without damaging, slip­
ping S6H

401 5.1st
Fry & Cox

272-4511
* * * * * * * * * *

Two girls won the right 
to enter state competition 
and two other youths ftom 
Bailey County placed well 
in the District 2 4-H Horse 
Show at Lubbock on July 2.

Winning first place in 
Registered Geldings under 
5 was Kim Farmer. She 
received a leather halter 
with engraved brass plat­
ing. Kim also placed 4th in 
Western Pleasure with her 
two year old gelding and 
qualified for state competi­
tion. Kim is the 16 year old 
daughter cf Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Farmer of Mule- 
shoe.

Kristi Spies placed first 
in the reining event and 
6th in western horseman­
ship, also qualifying her 
for state competition. 
Kristi is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Spies.

Scottie Spies, the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Spies 
placed 9th in the reining 
event.

Brenda Flowers placed 
10th in western pleasure. 
She is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Flowers.

The State 4-H Horse 
Show will be held on the 
week of July 13-18 at 
Waco, Texas. Each district 
in the state of Texas will 
send their best 20 qualifi­
ers to the state show. Also

to be held in conjunction 
with the qualigying show is 
the State Western Pleasure 
Futurity for two year olds 
and the Yearling Halter 
Furturity.

Over 130 contestants 
from 20 counties partici­
pated in this show. Show 
judge was Doug Shores of 
Houston.

S T A T E  C A P ITA L

HI6HLI6HTS
By Lyndall Wiliam* 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION

AUSTIN—Less than a 
month after the Legislature 
ratified new boundary lines 
for state House and Senate 
districts, the entire redis­
tricting process is in up­
heaval again.

Governor Bill Clements 
h a s  vetoed the plan for the 
Senate, thereby allowing the 
plan to be redrawn by the 
constitutionally provided re­
districting board, composed 
of five state officials.

The board, headed by Lt. 
Gov. Bill Hobby, tried to 
meet for the first time last

week, but postponed action 
pending the outcome of a 
lawsuit filed last week which 
challenges the new House
districts.

The class action lawsuit, 
with three legislators head­
ing up the list of plaintiffs, 
c h a i g c s  i hat counties have 
been illegally split in each 
of the five major metro­
politan areas: Dallas, Fort 
Worth. San Antonio, Hous­
ton and El Paso, as well as 
Laredo and Amarillo.

A state district judge was 
scheduled to near the case 

_ this week

for the plaintiffs, the new 
House districts will be. in­
validated and the redistnct- 
,ng board will assume the 
usk  of drawing an accept­
able plan.

Congressional Redistricting
Meanwhile, Clements has 

not backed down one iota 
from his announced intent 
to veto any plan approved 
during the coming special 
session which does not pro­
vide for a black congres­
sional district in his home­
town of Dallas.

The Legislature adjourned 
last month without reach­
ing a compromise on new 
congressional districts. Due 
to population growth, Texas 
is entitled to create three 
new congressional district**,

No one can dispute with 
us the place in the sun 
that is our due.
-William II, German^.

ft

EXTRA SPECIAL. SPECIAL
Five Point

006 FOOD
THREE W AY'S LAYTON 

IN ALL STAR GAME 
Keith Layton of Three Way 
High School will play for 
the West All Stars in the 
Texas Six Man All Star 
game on July 18 at Tarlc- 
ton State University. Lay- 
ton, an all district selec­
tion, averaged 18.4 points 
per game and 14 rebounds 
a game last season.

50 LB BAG

A 3 6
25 LB BAG

E  1

9* A M

Single burner model with 270 sq in 
chromed steel cooking grid 
li lt  Price $150 50
lr*»  20%  30 10

120 40
Plus in* toilet i o n ..................  70 00

190 60
5%»o l«sto«  ...........  + 52

CASH PRICE $199 92
•UDGCT PRICE* $241 92

Budget forms, no down payment 
$6.72 per month for 36 month*

Dual burner and controls let you use 
one hall or oil of burner 326 so in cost 
ironcookm ggrid
list price............ $22100
less 20%  . . . .  44 20

176 80
Plus mstollotion ....... 70.00

246 80
5 %  soles to.   12 34
CASH PRICE $259 14
BUDGfT PRICE* $313 54

Budget terms no down payment 
$871 per month for 36 months

N othing b e a ts  the  sm oked 
flavored ta s te  of so m e th in g  
from the  grill . . . and no grill\ 
can b ea t th e  fun, conven ience  • 
and  econom y of a v ersa tile  gas 
grill.

G a s  G rillin g  Is  versatile

You can  sixxle a steak grill a burge r sm oke a 
ham  barbecue a bird, roast an ear. even bake a 
P< tato. You can cook  .nany different foods a 
variety of ways m any at the sam e time on  a 
versatile g a s  grill.

Gas Grilling Is delicious 

You get that grfcat outdpor sm oked flavor 
w ithout the charcoa l m ess, no  lighter fluid is 
needed and  a g a s  g r ill requ ires very little clean 
up. There § no  wal* either because g a s  g i i i l \  
reOThtxtdkfhg tem perature . . . fast.

I ______  —
Gas G rilling is  econom ical 

You can cook a full fam ily meal for ju st 
pennies. G a s g r ill in g  co sts  le ss tha.i a third of 
what It would cost on  an electric g i* ll and  test 
than  a tenth of the cost for charcoa ling. A 
national survey proved It.

Gas Grilling is  cooler

It keeps the heat out of the kitchen so  your air * 
co nd it ion in g  won't have to work so  hard. That s 
Im portant d u r in g  the sum m er . . .  p lu s  a ga s  
grill Is  the perfect m eal m aker for any season  of 
the year.

A nd  G as Grilling Is now  2 0 %  off

Buy now and you I, M » f  2 0 V  The purchatc 
price h a t  been reduced 2 0 %  hut on ly  until 
A ugu st  I 1981 . and  you have eight styles 
and s ite s  to choose  from with all the features l  
to m ake g r ill in g  fun. convenient and  eco 
nom lcal.

DUCANE
Ducona cotl alum inum  grille laature 

top ported alo inlett ttaal burner, 
which loti longer ond tove go , . ond 
o unique cool grote datignad  lo  pravant 
flora up, and graa ta  co llod ion  at thn 
bottom of Tho firebox. Som a m odal, 
hova Rotit-A-G rota*. o  taporota vacticol 
burnar for rotitilng  from  bahind  tha 
maot ond porcaioin irad d a a l co st in g  
gridt.

Tho Challenger 800
Only $ 8 . 5 7  p#r month

Single burner model with 305 
nkkei chrome plated grid
list price 
less 20%

$316 00

172 80
Plus instoiiation 70 00

5%  soles i o n ............................
242 80 

. 13 14
t } |CASH PRICE $354 94

BUDGET PRICE* *30* 53
Budget terms no down 

$8 57 per month for 36 months
payment

I  jJ  )  Th*
: ;j 1 Champion 4000

The Challenger 1300 
Only $ 1 2 . 2 7  par month

Twin burners duol controls one for
eoch side which waves gas when you 
don't need lo use the total cooking %ur 
face 405 sq in nkkei chrome plated 
god
listpnce $347 00
less 20%  69 40

277 60
Plus intfollotion 70 00

347 60
5 %  soles lax 17 38
CASH PRICE $364 98
BUOOfT PRICE* $44173

Budge* lerms r*o down pay maot 
$12.77 per month for 36 months

The Trophy 7000
Only $ 1 4 . 8 9  par month

two humar, on* with a 110 tq in 
porcaiotnliod ,t**l tooting grid th. 
othor o ten, A Grot** voruroi humor 
rohMIng motor and ipit ond d actrank 
ignition
littprK * *1,0 00

H i t  
M l 00

Plu, inttoitotwn TV oo
• »  00

IN  tolo, to, ]| io
C A W P d l l  M U  10auooti mcc tu. o.

Only $21.92 par month*
A ll (ho toaturo, ot tha Trophy 7000 pock 
o#od m on otogont cart w *h  largo ttor 
o * .  araoo -odwood u o -u C  ,,<*. thoH \  ]
hoavy &>*> w hooh ond conoaction

JACUZZI JE T  CHEF
Jocu iii Jot Chat co«t alum inum  grill, 

faotura Chor Brown anom al finith. rud- 
ratittont porcalo in iiad  co»t iron cooking 
grid, c o d  iron ond nickal alloy burnar,
and hoot indicator on lid. Jet Chef 3010

Only $10.07 par month'

Singlo humor ond control with 140 tq 
cooking surfoce 
list price 
less 30%

Plus mstollotion

5 %  soles Ion

CASH PRICE ..............
BUDGET PRICE*

Budget lerms no dov n 
$10 07 per month lor 36 months

$14 89 per month io* 36 month*

ll* 'P rt*«  *720 00
it t l  20N I n  00

57,00
Phn •nitoHo'ton go

431 00
IN to to ito i j| os
CASH PWCt IA3J0S
•OOGtt PA1C*- $709 13

M l

*31 *1 por month tor 3, month.

Jet Chef 4020 
Only $12.32 par month

lorgoi gtlllltoad with twin bufftot duol 
lo n h o li ond 1M  tq In look ing grid 
tiltprK. |M , 00
Iq u X N  ««H

* n  jo
Plu, in.toM.tton yg qq

M ,  30
IN  total to* . it  44
CAW PtICI Uh* M•unc.lt PMCf ,,

hudg.1  torm, no down paymant 
*11 W  pat month to, 34 month.

t i U

ill

'Budgat torm, ora avoiiobla at 
17-1/4% annual intatad on tho 
daciinmg balonca prica rndudo, M ia, 
tax ond norma1 pod typo in,foliation 
•xcapt for liuconaChotnpion 4000

o

»

9

tr.

A___
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Deadline For Classified Ads Is 11:00 
Teesdays Aid Fridays

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion,

Per Word S.1S 
Minimum Charge - 

S2.00
2nd Insertion,

Per Word -S. 13 
3rd Insertion,

Per Word-S. 10 
Minimum Charge— 

SI.80
Vi Cheaper to run 

Classifieds 3 times or more 
CARD OF THANKS 

25 W ordsS3.00  
Over 25 Words 

Charged at regular 
Classified Rates 

Classified Display- 
Si. 55 per column inch 

Double Rate for 
Blind Ads 

DEADLINE FOR 
'INSERTION 

11 a.m. Tues. for Thurs. 
11 a.'m. Fri. fo r  Sun. 
WE,RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

- AN Y AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE POR 
AN Y ERROR AFTER AD 

HAS RUN ONCE.

I r a .

GOLDEN OPPORTUNITY- 
Olan Mills Studio needs 
several individuals free to 
travel Texas. Car neces­
sary. Excellent position for 
former Cosmetic, Jewelry 
and Tupperware represen­
tatives. Average earnings 
exceed S250 per week with 
guaranteed salary, plus 
commission, plus expense. 
Call Mrs. Armstrong col­
lect 817-665-1122, 9a.rn.-3
p.m.
3-28t-ltc

TT-r-r « -« -■ !» ■  ■ i t n  ■ ....................................

Information on Alaskan 
and overseas employment. 
Great income. Call 602- 
941-8014 Dept. 511. Phone 
Call Refundable.
3-28t-4ttc
'••••«•***••*••••*••«••••

5. APTS. FOR RENT .
«p*******************«**
.FOR RENT, 1,2, & 3 bed- 
room apartments, (utilities

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, brick, living room, 
den with fireplace, office, 
Richland Hills. 272-4701. 
8-21 t-tfc

Unfurnished except 
and refrigerator.

1. PERSONALS 
»*****•*•••*••••••*••

WE BUY USED 
FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 

. HARVEY BASS 
APPLIANCE 

l-18s-tfc

paid, 
stove
Starting$215 or less. Call 
collect 1-806-247-3666. 
5-22t-8tc Friona, Texas.

New - Nice - 1 Bedroom 
Apartment. 272-3107. 
5-28t-tfc
a***********************

8. REAL ESTATE 
FOR SALE

•••••* ••••••••* •••* ••••*

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE 

232 Main 272-4838 
Joe and Ricky 

Smallwood

3 bedroom brick home, 
one bath, 1 car garage.

2 bedroom stucco, one 
bath, Country Club 
Addition.

Brick, 3 bedroom, 2 
baih, 1 car garage. 8th 
Street.

See or Call 
Joe or Ricky 

8-19s-tfc

Let us put your wedding in 
beautiful pictures. Call 
Oecia for your date. 385- 
5169. 512 Phelps. Little­
field. Texas 79339. 
l-28t-tfc

Krebba Real Estate
S a t r s a n d  A p p r a is a l*

201 W. Ave.C 
Muleshoe, Texas

Custom fam ing, 8 row 
equipment. Reasonable 
rates call 272-5317 before 8 
a.m. or after 7 p.m. 
,l-16s-tfc

Extra income at home. 
Crocheting, knitting, hand 
embroidering and ‘sewing. 
It interested call Charlies 
Originals 272-5180 Monday 
through Friday 9-5:30. 
1.25s-tfc

REALTYINC.
Box 627 

109 Fifth St. 
Farwell, Texas 79325 
Phone [806J 481-5288 

or 481-9149

oO Acres west of Mule- 
shoe on highway. One 6 
inch well, side - roll 
sprinkler. Steel buil­
ding. 2 sets of nice 
improvements.

..... .
160 acres northwest of 
Muleshoe, 2 wells, lays 
good on FM highway.

Own your own Jean Shop. 
Offering all the nationally 
known brands such as Jor- 
dache, Vanderbilt, Calvin 
Klein, Sedgeficld, Levi and 
over 70 other brands. 
S13.500.00 includes begin-

rig inventory, airfare for 
to the apparel center, 
training, fixtures, and 

Grand Opening Promo­
tions. Call Mr. Loughlin at 
Mademoiselle Fashions 
612-835-1304. 
l-28t-ltc

•* * ••••* ••••••••••••••••• '
2. LOST & FOUND 

•••••••••••••a**********

Cat lost in vicinity of cem­
etery on West 84, yellow 
and black female, calico. 
Answers to the name of 
Suprena. S10 reward of­
fered. Call 272-3061. 
?-26t-tfc . _

3. HELP WANTED

Avon Representatives 
Needed in Muleshoe area. 
Call Nettie 272-3208 or 
Oneida 272-3346.
3-28t-tfc

8-49s-tfc

FOR SALE- Bud Myers 
Home Place. 18 acres. 
Northwest of Muleshoe. 
Call Pauline 817-723-5075 
or 817-691-2615.
8-27t-3tp

HOUSE FOR SALE 
Country Gub Addition. 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, brick 
home. Double car garage. 
Huge fenced backyaru. 
272-5588 weekdays or 272- 
3347 nights and weekends. 
8-28t-tfc ...----------  r

House for sale by owner. 
Need to sell immediately! 3 
bedroom, 1 bath. Good 
condition. 1913 W. Birch. 
Call 272-3843.
8-24s-tfc

TOWN and 
COUNTRY

R E A L  E S T A T E
H IG H W A Y  2 1 4  N O R T H  

M U L E S H O E .  T E X A S

3 bedroom, 2 bath, 2 car 
garage, fireplace and 
storm celler. All for
565.000. 00 1714 W. Ave. 
G

3 bedroom, 2 bath, brick 
V home. Has it's own 
well and lots of extras.
564.000. 00 1816 W. Ave.
C

Nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath,
2 car garage, brick ve­
neer house in Country 
Gub Addition, S45.000

Stucco house, 3 bed 
room, 2 bath, remodeled 
inside and out, priced at 
825.000 207 W. 12th.

HOUSE FOR SALE: Rich 
land Hills Division. 3 bed­
room, 2 bath brick home, 2 
car garage, brick storage 
building and fenced yard. 
1828 W. Ave. E  Inquire 
ne xt door or call 272-3644. 
8-16t-tfc
.................................................—

FOR SALE: 160 acres of 
land in Lamb County. Per­
fect quarter section. 
272-3191.
8-24t-9tc

For all your real estate 
needs call:

GLAZE 8  GOFORTH

l i : AVE. c  
272-4208

8-11-tfc

FARMS RANCHES HOMES

Ladies, we heve an open- JOHN W. SMITH,
% ing for f full time recep- Iroksr

We want you/ husthass.
REMEMBER 

REID REAL ESTATE 
THURSIE REID 

272-3142 
OR

George Niaman
965-2488

OR
Dianne Niaman 

965-2488

8-19s-ttfc

9. AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE

FOR SALE: Motorcycle - 
1977 Kawasaki KZ 1000, 
cruise, verier fairings, 
saddle bags and box, and 
custom scat. Call 385-4659 
qfter 6 p.m. Roland Bell, 
Littlefield. 82,400.00 
11-lls-tfc

1978 Chevrolet pickup with 
camper top. Call 965-2390. 
9-28t-4tc

1981 T-Bird, 6,000 miles, 
loaded, still under warran­
ty, $8,300. Will consider 
trade. 704 W. Ave. K 
272-3612 
9-28t-3tc

Surplus jeeps, cars, trucks. 
Car inventory value S2143 
sold for $100. Similar bar- 
gain available. Call for 
information 602-941-8014 
ext. 511. Phone Call Re­
fundable.
9-28t-4ttc

GMC Cube Truck. 671 De­
troit Tandem Axle. 5 speed 
transmission, 21 foot bed. 
V-boriom, rear door and 
lenloadirg door. Call 915- 
758-2375.
9-28t-4tc
a***********************

10. FARM EQUIPMENT 
FOR SALE

New prime pipe 3/4 in. 32 
cents ft., 1 in. 43 cents ft. 
used tin upset 71 cents ft. 
new 2 in. upset 77 cents ft. 
used V* in. plate real good 
12 cents ft. new 4 in. 
thread collar $3.95 ft. 12 
and 16 in. water well cas­
ing. Call Farwell Pipe and 
Iron 481-3287 
10-24s-8tc

FOR SALE OR TRADE: 
M-5-Moline Tractor. Wide 
front ent. P.S., LP Gas. 
Torque amp. New tirest 
front and rear. 806-272- 
7452.
10-27t-4tc

FOR SALE: M<x*el &50 
New Holland Round Baler. 
Good condition. 946-3421 
or 946 3479.
10-2 /t-tfc

FOR SALE: Model 490 
New Holland Swather. 
Good condition. 946-3421 
or 946-3479.
10- 27t-tfc
a**********************,.
11. FOR SALE OR TRADE 
••eeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee
FOR SALE: Small one 
bedroom house. To be 
moved. New roof. 481-9016
11- 2St-4tc

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom 
trailer, partially furnished. 
272-4316 or 272-3280. 
ll-28t-4tc

FOR SALE: Alfalfa Hay-

Ricky Bennett
Call 806-825-3822 

ll-20t-tfc

FOR SALE: 1«73 Open 
Road Motor Home. Can 
see at 301 E. Chicago. 
ll-27s-4tp

•****•*•*•*$*»*•**••*«*«'
12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

•a**********************-
BURROWS 

UPHOLSTERY £ND  
FURNITURE REPAIR 

118 W. AVE. C 
in the rear 

PHONE 272-4255 
12-30s-tfc

15. MISCELLANEOUS
a***********************

ROUNDUP 
1 Gallon - $65.00 

5 Gallon - $317.00 
Call 806-799-0708 after 
6, Randy Trotter.

FOR SALE
Rolodex Rotary Card 
Files, Tray Files, Visi­
ble Card Cabinets, 
Steel Card File Cabi- 
nets-assorted sizes. 
Very reasonable. Also.
10- key Victor mecha­
nized calculator. See at 
Bailey County Electric 
Coop, 305 E. Avenue B, 
Muleshoe, Texas, or 
call 806-272-4504.
11- 27t-3tc

$1000 Acre for corn. Turn 
$440/Acre Com to $1000. 
Call Big Tex 817-675-8357. 
17-27t-6tp

3 Family Garage Sale 
Saturday Only 9-6 

1616 W. Ave. C 
15-28t-ltc

Want a propane system? 
check with 

SMITH LP GAS 
MULESHOE 

15-30s-tfc

FRANK'S 
REFRIGERATION 

APPLIANCE & SERVICE 
PARTS & REPAIR

315 W. 3rd Ph. 272-3822 
15-7t-tfc

-  -Cage Conairuetian
Bob Gage

<•*' Specialize in Custom 
Fireplaces 

Phone 272-5240 
Or

272-5105 
af Muleshoe 
Home Center

213 S. 1st 
Muleshoe. Texas 

I5-4s-tfc

Someone wanted to do 
yardwork at 516 W. 8th. 
15-27s-2tc

Someone said ‘‘I have 
not seen your ad in the 
paper." Well - thanks 
Muleshoe - 1 have had 
more work than I could 
get to. So why ask for 
more? Am scheduled 
through August. Anyone 
interested in schedule of 
September? October? 
November or December? 
Please NO RUSH jobs. 
Don’t want to disappoint 
anyone. So if you are 
thinking about painting 
the house -- or one room 
-  please get scheduled.

HAVE BRUSH 
WILL PAINT 

Call Charles Harvey 
272-4059 or 272-3574 

For Free Estimate 
And Appointments For 

Scheduling 
15-27s-3tc

Watchdog
The tsxas Contunw Association 

Education Fund's Report

fty jm Pmsrtrt

“Leave the driving to us,” 
advertises a bus line.

“Ship it by rail—we deliver,” 
the railroad industry assures 
freight customers.

“Humpin’ to please,” claims 
a truck company.

But is transportation service 
all that reliable in Texas? Com­
pany managers, as well as state 
regulators of the industry, say it 
is almost flawless. They boast 
that truck, bus and rail service in 
Texas is “the envy of the na­
tion."

Well, maybe so, but the exec­
utives and regulators have been 
so busy patting themselves on 
the back that they don’t seem to 
have noticed that the cus­
tomers—those Texans ori the re­
ceiving end of the line—have not 
joined in this chorus of praise.

•"Try getting merchandise 
delivered from Dallas,” says a 
downtown merchant in 
Athens—“They come when 
they’re good and ready, and they 
don’t care if my business withers 
on the vine out here.”

•Up in Knox City, a town of­
ficial recalls that the whole town 
joined hands to keep their 
freight depot open, but the rail­
road shut it anyway—“They ad­
mitted they were making money 
here,” he said, “but some man­
ager at headquarters wanted to 
centralize operations in Abilene, 
so they chopped us off.”

•An elderly woman in Alamo 
says that she wants to go to 
Houston every few months to 
visit her grandchildren, “But the 
bus service is a joke now, so I 
don't go as much.”

What’s happened is that our

Public Notice
NOTICE TO ALL PER­
SONS HAVING CLAIMS 
AGAINST THE ESTATE 
OF LUCY M. YOUNG, 
DECEASED

Notice is hereby given 
that original letters testa­
mentary upon the estate of 
Lucy M. Young, Deceased, 
were issued to me, the 
undersigned, on the 6th 
day of July, 1981, in the 
proceeding indicated below 
my signature hereto, which 
is still pending, and that I 
now hold such letters. AH 
persons having claims a- 
gainst said estate, which is 
being administered in the 
County below named, are 
hereby required to present 
the same to me at the 
address below listed, be­
fore suit upon the same are 
barred by the general sta­
tutes of limitations, before 
such estate is closed, and 
within the time prescribed 
by law. My post office 
address is Route 2, Mule­
shoe, Texas 79347.

R.L. Scott (S)
R.L. Scott, Executor of the 
Estate of Lucy M. Young, 
Deceased, No. 1454, in the 
County Court of Bailey 
County, Texas. 
l-28t-ltc

16. LIVESTOCK

WANTED: 200 head of 
calves to graze on 80 acres 
irrigated pasture. 285-2569 
or 285-2737.
16-28t-2tc

state regulators have allowed the 
trucking firms, railway com­
panies and bus lines to establish 
territorial franchises ir. various 
areas of the state, and too often 
these monopolistic companies 
leave customers a mighty rocky 
road to travel, if any at all.

The three members of the 
Texas Railroad Commission are 
the public’s overseers of the 
multi-billion dollar transporta­
tion industry in Texas, and they
are the ones to talk to if you’ve 
got problems with the way 
things are being run.

The commissioners, who are 
elected, say they want to hear 
from you. On June 18, they even 
held an open hearing about the 
state of the transportation in­
dustry, and their press an­
nouncement invited industry ex­
ecutives, shippers of goods, 
local officials and “any other in­
terested persons” to comment.

Trouble is, the public hearing 
was a bit more “open” to the 
industry itself than it was to cus­
tomers, so the commission’s 
meeting was stacked and the tes­
timony one-sided.

In the first place, the billpay- 
ers were expected to learn about 
the hearing through the press, 
which would have been fair 
enough had all parties been noti­
fied that way. But the commis­
sioners played favori'es with the 
industry by mailing special let­
ters of invitation directly to the 
executives of rail, bus and truck 
companies. No such letters went 
to farm groups, county commis­
sioners, passenger associations, 
transportation unions, cham­
bers of commerce or other “out­
siders” who also have a stake in 
the industry.

Worse yet, the commissioners 
actually held their hearing at the 
annual convention of the Texas 
Motor Transportation Associa­
tion, an industry lobby group! 
This was done “as a convenience 
to panicipants,” said the com­
missioners. That's not letting the 
fox in the hen house; that's haul­
ing the hens to the fox den.

Well, just because the Rail­
road Commission put on this 
hearing strictly for the conven­
ience of the industry doesn't 
mean they can ignon you. These 
are elected officials, duty-bound 
by law to hear what you have to 
say. If you want to get hold of 
the commissioners to let them 
know what you think, write to 
them at this address: Texas Rail­
road Commission/Capitol Sta­
tion/Austin, Texas/78711.

Public Notice ..
NOTICE TO ALL PER­
SONS HAVING CLAIMS 
AGAINST THE ESTATE 
OF TALIHINA JOHNSON. 
DECEASED.

Notice is hereby given 
that original Letters Testa­
mentary for the Estate of 
Talihina Johnson were is­
sued on the 6th day of 
July, A.D. 1981, in Cause 
No. 1453, pending in the 
County Court of Bailey 
County, Texas, to: Leroy 
Johnson.

The residence of such 
Executor is Rt. 1, Here­
ford, Texas 79045. All per­
sons having claims against 
this Estate which is cur­
rently being administered 
are required to present 
them within the time and 
in the manner prescribed 
by law.

Dated the 6th day of 
July. A.D. 1981.

Leroy Johnson (S)
Leroy Johnson, Executor of 
the Estate of Talihina 
Johnson, deceased, Num­
ber 1453, in the County 
Court of Bailey County, 
Texas. 
l-28t-ltp

Enochs News
H ®

Mrs J.D. Bayless

** * * *

Paula Nichols spent 
Saturday night with an 
aunt, Mr. and Mrs. I..B. 
Davis at Shallowater, and; 
she caught the plane at 
Lubbock Sunday and flew 
to Austin, where her aunt, 
Myrlene Nichols of San 
Antonio, picked her up to
spend the week with her.

*****
Walter Layton fell in his 

home Friday afternoon end 
hurt his hand and ribs. His 
nephew Lee Olan Chick of 
Borger and a neice, Mr. 
and Mrs. Morris Hampton 
of Amarillo came Sunday 
for a visit with them. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 

Nichols and Kristen of El 
Paso returned home 
Monday after spending 
several weeks with his 
parents , the Dale Nichols 
and helping with the wheat 
harvest.

•••« •
After this week the 

wheat harvest will be 
completed. The farmers 
are busy plowing their
l a nd .

••••*
Stacy and Jona 
Youngblood of Roswell, 
N.M. spent the week with 
their grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Crown, Their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Youngblood came 
for them over the weekend. 

*****
Clarence Cannon, 82, of 

Bula died tuesday1
morning. His funerai was 
2p.m. Thursday at the 
Bula Baptist Church. The 
dinner was at the
Methodist Church. We 
wish to express our 
sympathy to his family.

w ho  Kno w s?
1. What state entered the 
union June 15, 1836?
2. Name the capital of
Connecticut.
3. What body of water 
divides the state of Mary­
land into two parts?
4. Who said: ‘‘More 
things are wrought by 
prayer than this world 
dreams o f ’?
5. What was the Apostle 
Paul’s Hebrew name?
6. What was considered 
the first U.S. excise tax?
7. Guadalcanal, of World 
War II fame, is in what 
group of islands?
8. What historical event 
occurred on June 22, 
1941?
9. What state is known as 
the Sunflower State?
10. To what does 
anthography refer?

Am wars Ta WIN Mows
1. Arkansas.
2. Hartford.
3. The Chesapeake Bay.
4. Alfred Tennyson.
5. Saul.
6. A whiskey tax, levied 
in 1791.
7. Solomon Islands.
8. The Germans began 
the invasion of U.S.S.R.
9. Kansas.
10. Description of flowers.

tionist. Must be personable 906 272-4671 . FOR SALE:, 1964 Ford
and well groomed. Call 
272-4592 for interview 
3-28t-2tc

Ai”207r*7
272-3725 

8-27s-tfc

Econoline Van. Runs good 
Call 272-5168 after 5 p.m  
9-27t-tfc

FOR SALE: Good, clean 
730 John Deere Tractor. 
Also Williams-Craft camp­
er for long, wide bed pick­
up. Call 272-3424 evenings 
or night. 
ll-27s-tfc

FOR SALE: Mechanics 
tools. Gean, good condi­
tion, roll chest, locks. No 
reasonable offer will be 
refused. Also Kelvinator 
refrigerated room air con­
ditioner. See at 1013 
2nd. Call 272-3208.

W.

11 -28t-2tc
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Briskets
Whole Beef Cry*0-Voc Pocker Trimmed
Trim Briskets

Fine For BBQ Lean & M eaty '»•

Bacon
Wilson Certified Sliced 16 oz. lb.

20 Pork Roast
Boneless Fresh Boston Butt

■ ja  Pork Steak
Boneless Fresh Boston Butt lb

5 3  Franks
D m i i  +  r w  D r i f O

American Kraft Singles 16 oz

collect a beautiful set of china throughNow you can_____________  _
this exclusive offer. Each week a different place 
setting piece will be featured at this special price and 
purchase requirement.

Matching accessories are also available to complete 
your collection. Each accessory is available 
throughout the program with no purchase 
requirement!

THIS WEEK’S FEATURE ITEM:

5 01 W. American Blvd. 
272-4739

Open Daily 8 am to 9 pm 

Open Sunday 9 am to 8 pm Porcelain China RP̂ ert 1 ^  E A C H
'  with each 'SOO 
Grocery Purchase

Cream Pies
Morton 14 oz. pkg.

Wagner
Jh irst Quencher 32 oz . btl

Milnot
Canned M ilk 13 oz. can

soap Bath Size 7* O ff 4 ’/ i  oz. bar

Joy 22 oz. btl.
Liquid Dish Detergent 13* Off

Orange Juice
Minute Maid 16 oz. can
Kitchen Bags
tall Hefty 30 ct. pkg.
Pinesol
Bathroom Cleaner 17 oz. con
Fig Newtons
Nabisco 16 oz. pkg.
Coffee Mate
Coffee Creamer 16 oz. jar

S a u c e  Lea & Perrin 5 oz. btl 
V in e g a r
Heinze w hite Distilled qt. btl..

Com Kits sg
Morrisons 6 oz. pkg. J
Ice Cream Mix

Soloda d oz. pkg.
Blueberry Muffin
Mix Morrison 7 oz. pkg.Smuckers Strawberry 18 cz. jar

Honey
Dews Western Full of Flavor lb

Yellow  Corn
Filled With Nutrition lb.
Squash
Yellow or Green Your Choice lb.
Lettuce Romoine 
Salad Favorite Bunch ea

“COUPONCfffUPON

89 il Miracle 
WhipMaxwell House 1 15 m

I
•10 M INIMUM PURCHASE •10 MINIMUM PURCHASE

BONUS SPECIAL BONUS SPECIALECIAL ]| BONUS SPECIAL

1 9 *  Margarine QC
Kraft Parkay 1 lb. p k g .% P

With One Filled Bonus Special Booklet

Fruit
Minute Maid Chilled 32 oz btl. H i  

With One Filled Bonus Special BookletWith One Filled Bonus Special Booklet With One Filled Bonus Special Booklet

in free
STAM PS

Gravey Train
Dry Dog food 10 lb. bag

s t a m p s

i | Hamburger Helper
\ | All Varieties 7 oz. pkg.

Folgers Instant 10 oz. jcr

Chuck
Roast Ground

Turkeys
Honeysuckle or Butterball 

USDA Grade A Various Sizes

Pork RoastBeef Boneless Center Cut

C huck Steak
Beef boneless Center Cut Lean

Pork Steak
Fresh Boston Butt Bone In

Del Monte

American Beauty

Fresh California

Nabisco

Spillmate

T o w e ls


