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Big Time 
Wrestling 
To Be Here

Area wrestling fans have 
a real treat  in store whea 
professional wrestling re ­
turns to Muleshoe Satur ­
day night. Included will be 
a longtime favorite Ricky 
Romero, who will team op 
with another favorite, 
Cyclone Negro, in a tag 
team match against  El 
Mongol and James  J. 
Dillon.

Cyclone Negro is a 250 
pound powerhouse froai 
Caracas,  Venzuela and 
was decorated by his 
government  for achieve­
ments in boxing, wrestling 
and weight lifting,

Romero needs no intro­
duction to wrestling fans la 
this area,  as he is a 
favorite of many years. 

They are featured in the 
main event  tag ' team 
match.

El Mongol is a 260 pound 
product of the USSR and 
came to the states by way 
of Central America. He ia 
said to be adept  at both 
Mongolian and Russian 
Sambo wrestling, both 
said to be very vicious 
styles where the wrestlers 
wear jackets.

El Mongol’s partner will 
be James-J.  Dillon, who at 
243 oounds makes un the 
other half of the "Odd 
Couple. ’ He is a native of 
Princton, N.J.  and is the 
son of a socialy prominent 
family. Dillon is said to be 
a wily, but  unethical 
athlete.

Tickets are on sale at both 
the Muleshoe State Bank 
and First National Baak for 
the Rotary-sponsored 
event.  Tickets for the 8:30 
p.m.  wrestling will be 
$4.50 for ringside, $3.50 
for general  admission and 
$2.50 for kids under the 
age of 12. Wrestling will 
begin at 8:30 p.m. this 
Saturday, August  4, at the 
Bailey County Exhibition 
Center and Coliseum.

Also sure to please the 
wrestling fans will be girl 
wrestlers.  Lei Lani Kai is a 
Hawaiian miss and she will 
meet Wenona Little Heart  
of Window Rock, Arix. in a 
special attraction match. 
Both girls will step into the 
ring at over 145 pounds.

In another match Hooker 
Ted Heath,  former pro 
rugby player from Eng­
land, and an ex-British 
paratrooper,  will meet
Can’t an pnga I ,  Cnl. 3

NEGRO

Around

Muleshoe
Clayton Ramm, aon of 
Ir. and Mrs.  Ernest 
amm received a $100 fall 
:holarship to the West  
exas State University 
gricultural Department,  
amm will major in Gene- 
I Ag. he is a 1979 
aduate of Muleshoe 
gh School.

as sa s
■ ilbert Salinas, 19 or 20 
Hereford, was trans- 

*ed by Singleton-Ellis 
nbulance to Mehtodist  
>spital in Lubbock at 
d-afternoon Tuesday, 
alinas received burns 
er approximately 40 per- 
n t o f  his body in an early 
tcrnoon explosion at 
:xas Sesame.

sseaa

General Rains Boost 
Area Colton Prospect
$10,000 Is Missing 
Says Local Sheriff

CUCUMBER HARVEST UNDERWAY-Twa workman at Rabart Rnls and Sana 
ehows soma of the tap grade cucumbers being processed at the plant this weak. With 
cncamber harvest In fall swing at this time, n foreman said the pepper harvest will be 
getting underway within the next two to three weeks.

Rotarians Question 
New Coliseum Rates

During the noon meeting 
of the Muleshoe Rotary 
Club on Tuesday, after a 
discussion of plans for the 
Rotary-sponsored wrest­
ling slated for Saturday, 
Coliaeum Manager
Tommy Black was asked to 
clarify new charges 
scheduled for use of the 
coliseum.

Black told the group that 
the commissioners had 
met three or four times 
during the last couple of 
months,  and said they 
wanted to put the coliseum 
on a break-even basis.

He said he was instructed 
by commissioners to com­
pile a proposal of different 
charges to charge for 
different things at the

Cattle-Vehicle 
Wrecks Seem 

On Increase
A pattern established in 

recent days of accidents 
involving vehicles and 
livestock continued from 
Friday night through Mon­
day night with four such 
accidents reported on 
Highway 84 northwest of 
M uleshoe.

Monday night, at 10:45 
p.m. a 1977 truck tractor 
driven by Dalton Lightfoot, 
of Lubbock, slammed into 
a black steer on the 
highway three miles nor th­
west of M uleshoe on High­
way 84. Lightfoot was not 
injured, although his truck 
received heavy front 
damage ,  according to DPS 
Trooper Jim Dulin.

At 10:48, a 1976 
Chevrolet  Camaro, driven 
by Steven Rowell of 
Lubbock, slammed into the 
same steer. Rowell was not 
injured and his vehicle also 
received heavy front end 
damage .  Both the Rowell 
vehicle and the Lightfoot 
vehicle had to be towed 
from the accident.

Two minutes later, at 
10:50 p.m. ,  a 1972 Buick, 
driven by Jimmy Pruitt of 
New Orleans.  La. also hit 
the black steer.  A pass ­
enger in the Pruitt vehicle 
received minor injuries. 
Pruitt was able to drive hit 
vehicle from the accident 
as it received light front 
end damage .

Trooper Dulin said the 
steer  was owned by Dr. 
Jerry Gleason. He also 
said all the vehicles were 
traveling southeast  at the 
time of the multi-acci­
dents.

At 11:55 a.m. Monday,  a 
pickup and a car collided at
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coliseum.
He explained that the 

‘Mexican Dances’ will be 
charge $110 base rate plus

YAC Asks 
Questions 
On Charges

A tentative work schedule 
for the miniature golf 
course being constructed 
by the Muleshoe Area 
Youth Activities Commit­
tee Inc. was set up 
Monday night during a 
meeting of the group.

It was decided to at tempt 
to get the lights
completed,  post holes dug,  
line poles installed and 
ditches dug for the water 
and sewer lines this week. 
Next week, the fence will 
be installed so sand and 
gravel can be ordered to do 

• the concrete work at the 
golf course.
W ayne Holmes and Keith 

Pate explained what has 
been done to date at the 
golt course site just  east  of 
the Bailey County Exhibi­
tion Center and Coliseum.

It was reported that only 
$36.50 was received from 
skating last Friday night, 
which is $13.50 short of the 
required $50 to rent the 
coliseum under the new 
rates.

Coliseum manager
Tommy Black was asked to 
clarify the new charges.  
He said none of the 
increase was his idea, but 
the county commissioners.  
He told the group that the 
commissioners established 
the new rates and told him 
he would abide by them.

He also told the group, 
that contrary to what the 
commissioner’s court 
Cn ’I • •  pnga I ,  Cnl. 1

an extra $40 for the
sheriff’s office to have 
officers at the dance.

On being questioned by 
the Rotary, he said the 
money will not be paid .o 
the officers, but will go 
into county funds. He had 
no answer as to why city 
police would not be used as 
they have been in the past.

Also, he said the former 
price for having a "M ex i ­
can Dance" at the 
coliseum was $50.

Tueday night, Muleshoe 
City Police Chief Johnny 
Richards commented,  
" W e  will continue to 
provide city police protec­
tion to the citizens, as we 
have in the past.
Con’t on page 8, Cal. 3

Baptists9
Festival
Saturday

Rev. Gene Prevo, pastor 
of the Trinity Baptist 
Church, said the church is 
sponsoring a music festival 
Saturday, August  4, at 
7:30 p.m. in the sancturay 
of the church.

The quartet  from the 
Trinity Baptist Church will 
be singing and the 
Believers from Tahoka will 
present  a concert of 
religious music.

Rev. Prevo said the 
Believers are members  of 
the Martin family and the 
group consists of Karen 
Taylor, Lonnetta Hudgens,  
Jeannie Isabel, Lee Sum­
mers,  and Gilda Taylor, 
pianist.

All interested persons are 
invited to join the congre- 
tation of the church for the 
concert,  concluded Rev. 
Prevo.

DAMAGED VEHICLE-Monty jones wna driver of this 
vehicle that atrack n large hall some twn miles 
aerthwaal of Maleshae In Highway 84 Friday night. 
Janes  was hospitalised overnight following the
accident.

According to a front page 
story in the Lubbock 
Avalanche-Journal on Sun­
day, July 29, a large 
amount of money is 
missing from the Bailey 
County Sheriff's office in 
M uleshoe.
This week, Bailey County 

Sheriff Dee Clements was

Writing Road 
To Reading 
Workshop Set

A "Writ ing Road to 
Reading" workshop will 
be conducted in the Mule­
shoe Junior High School 
library August 6-10 from 8 
a.m.  - 3 p.m.,  according to 
an announcement  by Neal 
B. Dillman, Superinten­
dent  of schools.

Mrs.  Ada Bandy, Curri­
culum coordinator, from 
Santa Fe. ISD Will be the 
istructor for the workshop.

"Wri t ing  Road to Read­
in g"  or the Spalding 
Method,  is a simplified 
method of teaching langu­
age arts in all grades to 
all students,  explained 
the superintendent.  This 
multi-sensory approach
enables the many children 
who inherit, to some 
degree,  the tendency to 
dyslexia and other neuro­
logical problems, to over­
come this handicap, he 
added.

Thirty-one Muleshoe
teachers and parents have 
already enrolled in the 
class, but there is still 
room for more people who 
are interested in attending 
the workshop.

The fee will be approxi­
mately $20, but if more 
people enroll, the fee will 
be reduced. Interested 
parents and other persons 
are asked to contact Mrs. 
Elizabeth Watson, director 
of instruction, at phone 
number 272-3325.

Templo Bautista 
Plans To Host 
A Tent Revival

Templo Bautista will con­
duct a tent revival. August 

• 5 through August 10, 
according to the minister. 
Rev. Ynes Aleman. 

Evangelist for the 
services will be the Rev. 
Tommy Garza from Fort 
Worth. A fulltime South­
ern Baptist Evangelist,  
Rev. Garza has done his 
studies in • the Mexican 
Baptist Bible Institute, San 
Antonio, Howard Payne 
University, Brownwood 
and in the Southwestern 
Baptist Theological Semi­
nary, Fort Worth,  
explained Rev. Aleman.

Director of music for the 
services will be Rudy 
Trevino, who is an 
educational director in 
Templo Bautista at Friona 
and his wife, Leticia 
Trevino, will be pianist.

The tent will be located at 
West  Second Street and 
Avenue h,  just east of the 
First Baptist Church.

Rev. Aleman said there 
will be preaching and 
gospel singing each night 
of the revival, starting at 8 
p.m.

The local minister said he 
and the members of 
Templo Bautista would 
like to invite each and 
every person in the 
community to attend the 
services, which will be 
translated into English.

Flooding Reported 
In Isolated Areas
Rain was again in the was reported on Tuesday

unavailable for comment,  
as he was reported to be in 
a hospital in Lubbock. 
District Attorney Jack
Young was in court
Tuesday afternoon and 
Bailey County Judge  Glen 
Williams was reported by 
his secretary to be out of 
town.

The story is reproduced 
in its entirety below:

By Travis Brown
Avalanche-Journal Staff
MULESHOE • Bailey 

County officials are baffled 
by the disappearance of 
$10,000 from a safe in the 
sheriff 's department .

" I  don’t know what 
happened to i t , " said 
Sheriff Dee Clements,  
"But  I feel like it's still 
going to show u p . "

The missing money 
$6,000 in cash and a $4,000 
cashier’s check • was a 
cash bond put up by a 
defendant  in a drug case.

The sheriff discovered 
the money was missing 
June 28, when the defen­
dant, Gary Hahn of

Can’t on page 8, Col.l

Calvary Baptist 

Schedules 
Gospel Concert

" W e ’re hoping for a 
large crowd to come out 
and enjoy an evening of 
gospel music ,"  said Rev. 
James  Williams, pastor of 
the Calvary Baptist Church 
in Muleshoe.

He was referring for the 
Gospel concert planned at 
the church by a group of 17 
voung people from the 
Pacific Coast Bible Baptist 
College. The chorale will 
present the concert at the 
church on Friday,
tomorrow, at 7:30 p.m.

Friday night, the nine 
girls and eight boys from 
the chorale, who are on a 
summer tour will be 
spending the night with 
various church members.

Rev. Williams said all the 
group are students at the 
Pacific Coast Bible Baptist 
College, and are presently 
on a summer  tour, travel­
ing from church to church 
with their concert.

weather picture in the 
area this week with back to 
back general rains both 
Monday night and Tues­
day night. Several months 
ago, Bailey County Exten­
sion Agent Spencer Tanks- 
ley said the area would 
need a good rain at the end 
of July to help produce a 
good cotton crop in the 
fall.

The moisture received 
the first two nights on this 
week may just be the lever 
necessary to produce a 
‘bu m per’ crop in the fall. 
However, there is another 
brighter side to the picture 
also. North of Bailey 
County, Parmer County 
lost a lot of crops to high 
wind and severe hail.

Apparently,  the hail cut 
off before reaching the 
Bailey County line, and the 
area just benefitted from 
the rain. No hail damage 
for the first two nights of 
the week was reported in 
this county.

On Monday night, a 
sandstorm slammed into 
the area ahead of the rain, 
reducing visibility to near 
zero and dumping tree 
limbs and small debris in a 
wide area. Then the rain 
started, also accompanied 
by high wind.

During the Monday night 
rain, only .65 was reported 
in Muelshoe with some 
slight wind damage,  
especially to trees.  The 
fitst rain on Monday fell 
around 9:15 p.m.,  followed 
by a second downpour 
around 2 a.m.,  depositing 
a total of .5 to .65.

Then on Tuesday night, a 
hard, heavy rain left 1.4 
inches in Muleshoe and 
resulted in some minor

flooding for a few hours.
In the area Mrs.  Loyd 

Stpehens in the West  
Camp community said 
they received only .2 on 
Tuesday night and .4 on 
Monday night. They also 
had high wind.

At Needmore,  some 
water was reported across 
the road, and Western 
Farm Supply said they 
received 1.1 on Tuesday 
night and .7 on Monday 
night for a two day total of 
1 . 8 .

At Lazbuddie,  no rain

night, according to Foster 
Fertilizer. On Monday 
night, the community 
received .3 with high wind 
and no hail.

Monday night, a trace of 
rain was recorded at the 
Muleshoe National Wild- 
life Refuge, followed by 
1.8 on Tuesday night.
In the Maple area,  Bill 

Eubanks at Maple Grocery 
said the community
received an inch of rain on 
Tuesday night and one half 
to one inch on Monday 
night.

Eubanks reported the 
rain to be a rather general 
rain, with almost everyone 
coming into the store 
reporting receiving m ea ­
surable precipitation.
From the Bula area.  Mrs. 

Jim Pat Claunch said they 
received approximately .3 
on Monday,  followed by 
half an inch on Tuesday 
night, and received high 
wind, but no hail.

The State Department  of 
Can’t on page 8, Col. 6

Football
Physicals
Scheduled

Muleshoe High School 
Athletic Director and Head 
Football Coach Mike 
Wartes has issued another 
reminder that football 
physicals for all high 
school football players will 
be at 2 p.m. on Sunday, 
August 5 at the field 
house.

He said it will be impor­
tant for all boys who plan 
to football to be at the field 
house to get their physical. 
Any prospective players 
who do not get their 
physicals at that time will 
be required to have the 
physical done at their own 
expense by their doctor.

Also, the first day of 
football practice will be 
Monday, August 13 for 
sophomores,  juniors and 
seniors. Freshmen will 
begin practice on Monday, 
August 20.

Football equipment  will 
be issued on Wednesday,  
August  8.

LOADING OUT FOTATOES--Aa potatoes are coming down Ike eoaveyora at Barrett 
Produce, they are separated Into smaller sacks, boxes and these 100 p aands  bags. 
The workmen here are lying bags and stacking them Into pallets for shipment. 
'S tan ’s Best* potatoes are shipped all over the coantry.
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Services Set 
Thursday For 
Pearl Seaton
Mrs. Pearl Elizabeth Sea­

ton, 89 of the Lazubddie 
Community died at 3:20 
a m. Tuesday morning in 
the West Plains Medical 
Center.

Services were set for 
10:30 a.m. this morning, 
Thursday, in the
Lazbuddie Methodist 
Church, officiating is Rev. 
Wesley Putnam, minister 
of the First United Metho­
dist Church of Hale

Juan Madrid Jr. 
Now On Dutv 
In California

Marine Lance Cpl. Juan 
Madrid Jr. ,  son of Juan 
and Avelina Madrid of 514 
W. Second Streed, Mule- 
shoe, has reported for duty 
with 1st Marine Division, 
Marine Corps Base, Camp 
Pendleton, Calif.

A 1979 graduate of Mule- 
shoe High School, he 
joined the Marine Corps in 
February 1979.

Center.  Assisting is Andy 
Rogers,  minister of the 
lazbuddie  Church of 
Christ. Interment was set 
in the Lazbuddie Cemetery 
with Singleton-Ellis
Funeral Home officiating.

Mrs. Seaton was a 
Parmer County resident 
since 1926 moving there 
from McCloud, Okla. She 
was born April 20, 1890 in

Edmond,  Okla. She was a 
member of the Lazbuddie 
Methodist  Church.

Survivors include one 
daughter ,  Mrs. Forrest 
Greene of Lazbuddie; 
three sons, Harvey Seaton

of Mabank,  and R.B 
Seaton and Jimmie 
Seaton, both of Lazbuddie; 
ten grandchildren and 21 
great-grandchi ldren.

money for the 'Sound
system for the Civic 
Center.

We were sorry to have to 
return it, but it was too 
much money involved for 
such a few of us.

Thank you so much for Thanks again,
the fine news coverage we Triangle C.B. Club
were given during the time Clara Lou Jones,  Sec.
we were trying to raise

Letters To 
The Editor

M uleshoe Journal,

Juanita Anthony 
Graveside Rites 
Conducted Here
Graveside rites for 

Juanita Anthony, 55, of 
Muleshoe were conducted 
at 10:30 a.m. Tuesday at 
Bailey County Memorial 
Park with Rev. Charles

Harvey, officiating.
Arrangements were by 
Singleton-Ellis Funeral 
Home.

Mrs.  Anthony died at 
3:10 a .m.  Sunday at 
Health Sciences Center  in 
Lubbock following a 
lengthy illness. She had 
been a resident of Bailey 
County since October 30, 
1978, moving here from

ANNOUNCING A

Granite Shoals.
She was married to Orel 

Leo Anthony on June 7, 
1951 at Odessa.  Mrs. 
Anthony was a Baptist.

Survivors include her 
husband.  Orel; two d a ug h­
ters, Mrs.  Marion Wilson, 
Muleshoe and Mrs. Linda 
Kay Albee, Seattle, Wash, 
eight grandchildren and 
one-great-grandchild.

As of August 4 Piggly Wiggly Is discontinuing 
S&H Green Stamps. It is all part of our 
relentless effort to fight Inflationary food
prices. Mo stamps mean even lower Plaaly 
Wiggly Prices. No Stamp

Willard Norman 
Gets Promotion 
W ith Marines
Marine Cpl. W illiard L. 

Norman, son of Jim and 
Ellawise W. Norman of 
Box 684, Muleshoe, has 
been meritoriously pro­
moted to his present  rank 
w hile serving with 1st 
Marine Division, Marine 
Corps base, Camp Pendle­
ton, Calif.

He received the accele­
rated promotion in recog­
nition of outstanding 
performance, duty profici­
ency and demonstrated 
professional abilities.

A 1977 graduate of Mule­
shoe High School, he 
joined the Marine Corps in 
April 1977.

Thereafter

Farmer Jones USDA Grade “AUSDA Heavy Western Beef6 Center - 4 Ends Combo 
( H A  A LAll Meat

Franks
West Plains 

Medical Center 
Report

With 
Backs & 
Giblets

ADMISSIONS...
July 26: Alma Pierson, 

Rosa B. Allison. Rubin 
Vega.
July 27: Linda Perez, 

Charles Johnson,  Jessica 
Jiminez. Allie Barbour.

July 28: Linn Box. Monty 
Jones.  Maria Sierra. 
Adriana Gonzalez, Benny 
Pena, Benita Vega, 
Russella Duncan, Hugh 
Gore, Larry Cralley 

July 29: Bill McIntosh 
July 30: Toni King

Prices Good thru Set., Aug. 4.1979
Red Ripe. Juicy Sweet. Cooling Tiste

Large Size Taste Tempting

DISMISSALS...
July 26: Lida Wilhite, 

Sherman Morgan, Jimmy 
Pitcock, Odessa Pritchard 
July 27: Eunice Evans, 

Flora Edwards,  T.J. 
Eubanks.

July 28: Raymond Hous­
ton, Alma Pierson, Lora 
Mears,  Charles Johnson 
July 28: Monty Jones,  

Ruben Vega, Rosa Allison, 
Mary McDerman, Maria 
Sierra and baby boy 

July 30: Linda Perez, 
Benny Ray Pena, Allie 
Barbour.

California Russet Bu Ik
Kitchen Treat

Yellow Garden Fresh

7 J u u l/a £ u tA

Fresh, Ideal for Salads or Relish TraysFrozen
Ass’t.
Varieties

Great In Tossed Salads!

B lu e
BONNET

Margarine
Macaroni & 

Cheese Dinne
While Supplies Last

Wink-Awake 
Alarm Clock
Wakes you, lets you sleep 
a few minutes, wakes you 
again Lighted dial, sweep 
second hand, chocolate 
color case 5 38Wx3'.Hx 
2' jD in 880 1168

Quantities Limited

(iJVf«CAroni
&  (nheevc

Ph. 272-4511 
401 So. First 
Mu leshoe Tex

7V«-oz.

fk Sunbeam*
1 a l l

l 3 t la8 7 4

now /
'•O O
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^Japanese  Youths Will Visit 
Bailey County This Month

MISS JUDY TILLEMA

Bridal Shower Held In 
Honor Of Judy Tillema

A Bridal Shower was held 
in honor of Miss Judy 
Tillema, bride-elect of Joe 
Bob Owen, on July 28 from 
2:30 to 4 p.m. in the home 
of Joyce Shafer.

Upon arrival, guests were 
registered by Jennifer

BIBLE VERSE
"Mine eyes are upon 

all their ways: they are not 
hid from my face, neither 
is their iniquity hid from  
mine eyes. ”
1. Who was the author of 
the above statement*
2. Of what disaster was 
he prophesying?
3. What is its meaning for 
us today?
4. Where may this verse 
be found?

Answers To Bible Verse
1. Jeremiah, the prophet.
2. The utter ruin of the 
Jews.
3. That God is ever cogni­
zant of our actions and 
knows our sins.
4. Jeremiah 16:17.

Tillema, sister of the 
honoree of Muleshoe.

A white lace cloth 
covered the serving table. 
It featured an a rrangement  
of apricot silk roses in a 
brass pot. Jennifer  Tillema 
and Rhonda Briggs served 
apricot sherber t  punch, 
melon balls, fruit breads,  
mints and nuts from 
crystal appointments.

The honoree was
presented with a corsage 
in her chosen colors of 
apricot silk and ecru bows 
and leaves.

The hostess gift was a set 
of bakeware.

Special guests  were the 
mothers of the couple. 
Mrs. Wayne Hardage and 
Mrs. Dick Tillema, both of 
M uleshoe.

Hostesses included Rose­
mary Briggs,  Sandy Peter­
son, Gwen Splawn, Eva 
Nell Stovall, Jo Harmon, 
Joyce Shafer and Emma 
Wilhite. * * * ,

The truth hurts people 
who don't like to face 
facts.

Japan  and the South 
Plains of Tesas are forging 
new ties this summer.

As part  of the 4-H Labo 
International Exchange,  27 
Japanese  youths have 
become, for a month, the 
sons,  daughters,  brothers 
and sisters of 25 area 
families. The young
people,  aged 12 to 18. are 
accompanied by a Ja p a n ­
ese tutor-chaperone.

Three of the Japanese 
youngsters will stay with 
families in Bailey County, 
Linda Mullin, county 
Extension agent ,  said, 
August  6-22, the Robert 
Hunts will have a 
tutor-chaperone,  Yoshiaki 
Hibino, staying in their 
home.

The guests ,  their ages,  
and their host families in 
Bailey County are: Maki 
Asada,  age 13, is staying 
with the Robert Hunt 
family; Kazubo Ikegami, 
age 16, is staying with the 
Homer Richardson family 
and Yasuo Suzuki, age 12, 
is staying with the Frank 
Wuerflein family.

The visitors are among 
149 Japanese  youths com­
ing to Texas under 
auspices of the Labo Foun­
dation, said Dr. John Pel­
ham, state 4-H and youth 
leader with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension 
Service. Over the past 
several year*, the founda-

m m m n n □ 3 3

Fruit tree yield 
will increase with 
this fertilizer and 
spray program.

ferti-lome

103 MAIN 272-4552

tion has sent several thou­
sand Japanese  youths to 
the United States, 
primarily the western 
states.

This is the second year 
Texas has been included in 
the program said Martha 
Couch, Extension area 4-ty, 
and youth specialist. It is 
one of the 18 states whTfll 
will be hosts to 1,700 
Japanese youth this 
summer . Last year, 68 
Japanese  youths came to 
Texas with 12 visiting the 
South Plains.

‘‘The Labo Foundation 
program is to help young 
people to learn another 
language and to become 
familiar with another 
culture f i r sthand,”  Pel­
ham said.

In District 2, host 
counties are Bailey, 
Briscoe, Cochran, Daw­
son, Gaines,  Garza, Lamb, 
Parmer,  Scurry and Swis­
her.

Certain!
A worried lady in Albany 

entered a notion store and 
bought two packages of invis­
ible hairpins.

‘‘Are you absolutely cer­
tain these arc invisible?” , she 
asked.

“ Lady, I'll tell you how 
invisible they are." the clerk 
assured her.

"I’ve sold S4 worth this 
morning and we've been out of 
them for three weeks."

I

-■ - 
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MRS. BENNY FLOYD AND BRANDY LYNN

Mrs. Floyd, Brandy Lynn 
Honored With Baby Shower

Mrs. Benny (Melinda) 
Floyd and one week old 
daughter ,  Brandy Lynn, 
were honored with a pink 
baby shower on July 30 
from 7:30 to 9 p.m. in the 
Community Room of
Tri-County Savings &
Loan.

Mrs.  Floyd was
presented with a corsage 
of pink and white baby 
booties with white bows.

Linda Cain registered 
guests upon arrival.

The serving table was
laid with a white lace cloth. 
Glass booties held an

M orton buildings
HORSE BARNS

M orton buildings 
MACHINE  

SHEDS
COMMERCIAL  
& INDUSTRIAL

"Let our building experience 
Improve your business"

M orton ^
B U IL D IN G S

GRAIN
STORAGE

• (iDVF.RNMKNT APPROVED
• VERSATILITY
• VERY PRACTICAL

|  Q  PI MM a n d  more information

I  T y p ._______________________

r~l PIm m  bore your Mtoeman phorw me M o r t o n  bu ild ing s  
“ENERGY 

PERFORMER”

B t i  1928

B U IL D IN G S ,  I N C

Plnlnvltw, Tt»«i____________

Amy Vaughn was
honored on her sixth 
birthday on July 12 in the 
home of her grandmother,  
Dorothy Hanley. Balloons 
and st reamers  decorated 
the rooms.

Birthday cake and punch 
were served to Gayla 
Rasco, Tanya Fisher, Suz­
anne Reid, Glenna Tester- 
man, Cindy Figley, Kenna 
Sue Richards,  Tracey and 
Carl Wayne Cunningham 
of Levelland.

Kendra Fisher was 
honored on her sixth bir th­
day when her parents,  Mr. 
and Mrs.  Kenny Fisher 
took Kendra and her 
friends to Littlefield to 
have pizza at the Pizza 
Hut.

The group returned to 
Kendra 's  home for blue 
and white ‘‘doll”  cake, ice 
cream and lemonade.

Those attending were 
Suzanne Reid, Gayla 
Rasco, Tanya Fisher, 
Glenna Testerman,  and 
Renea Mixon of Amarillo.

• • • • •
Stephanie Thorton was 

honored on her seventh 
birthday with a party that 
took place in a city park on 
July 12.

“ Holly Hobbie”  cake, ice 
cream and punch were 
served to those attending, 
Monica, Wadona and 
Crystal Bond, Kelli Baker, 
Kay Lynn Gordon, Ambyr 
Donnell,  Jarod Bellar, Jay 
Harrison, Hyla Ford, 
Alicia Seymore and Step­
han Thorton.

The Methodist  Church 
elementary children were 
in Lubbock Wednesday to 
attend the show. They 
were sponsored by Kim 
Hurst ,  Tanna Stephans,  
Sandra Nix, Joann Gaston 
and Ann Carson.

• • • • •
Noble Dudgeon is a 

surgical patient in the 
Methodist  Hospital of 
Lubbock. It was reported 
that he suffered a stroke 
Wednesday morning.

• » • • •
Mr. and mrs. Ken Day of

Fieldton visited recently 
with Mr. Ves Terry and
Les Hewitt.

• • • • •
Mr.  and Mrs.  Guy 

Walden and grandchildren 
were in Clovis Saturday for 
dinner.

Mr. and Mrs.  Nolan 
Parrish were in Lubbock 
Tuesday on business.

• • • • •
Mrs.  Wyatt,  mother of 

Mrs.  Tom King, was 
t rsnsfered this week from 
the Methodist  Hospital in 
Lubbock to the Amherst

Hospital.

Sunday visitors in the 
home of Edith Williams 
were Gedonne Williams, 
Kevin and Greg of Clovis, 
N.M .and Mr. and Mrs.  
Larry Puckett and Kalen of 
M uleshoe.

• • • • •
Mr. and Mrs.  Paul 

W ersell of Carlsbad visited 
last weekend with her  
aunt,  Mr. and Mrs.  Joe 
Dorsey.

Mr. and Mrs.  Bud Pro­
vence and Charles Rich 
were in Melrose, N.M. 
Sunday to attend the 
funeral of Jessie Sain.

• • • *•
Visiting last weekend 

with Mrs. Marv Wilkerson 
was her  daughter ,  Mrs.  
Gennie Chamberlain.  The 
women went to Lubbock 
Saturday to visit their sons 
and brothers,  Mr. and 
Mrs.  Wayne Wilkinson 
and Mr. and Mrs.  Dan 
W ilkenson.

• • • • •

Doug Provence was 
honored on his sixth bir th­
day on July 10 when his 
mother,  Jeanne  Provence, 
took Doug and his friends 
to Clovis, N.M. to the zoo 
and Amusement  park.

Cupcakes and lemonade 
were served to those that 
at tended including, Char ­
lie Smith, Len Kuykendall,  
Charles Williams, Monty 
Edwards,  Heather Chase,  
Bryan Baker and Dannette 
Provence.

• • • • •
Mr. and Mrs.  Marvin 

Maxwell were in Fort 
Sumner last week to visit 
her sister,  Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Smith.

MISS TERRI BRYANT

TerriBryant 
Named 
At Shower

Miss Terri Bryant, 
bride-elect of Terry Tracy, 
both of Amarillo was feted 
with a bridal coffee on July 
28 from 3 to 4:30 p.m.  in 
the home of Mrs. S.A. 
Lambert.

Guests were greeted by 
the honoree. Miss Bryant; 
her mother,  Mrs.  A.C. 
Bryant of Muleshoe and 
Mrs.  Lambert.

The hostesses presented 
Miss Bryant with a corsage 
in her chosen colors of rose 
and white silk flowers.

The serving table was 
laid with a white hand 
crocheted cloth. An 
arrangement of rose and 
white silk flowers centered 
the table. Crystal appoint­
ments were used to serve 
pink thumbprint  cookies, 

‘punch,  nuts and mints.
The hostess gifts

included a vacumn cleaner

and the silk floral a r r ange ­
ment used on the serving 
table.

Special guests  were aunts 
of the honoree,  Geraline 
Patterson of Lubbock, and 
Letha Patterson and Liona 
Patterson,  both of Mule­
shoe.

Hostesses were Mrs. 
S.A. Lambert ,  Mrs.  Jack 
Obenhaus,  Mrs.  Harlan 
Davis, Mrs.  Harold
Cowan, Mrs.  Robert Luns­
ford, Mrs.  Carl Houston. 
Mrs. Johnny Williams, 
Mrs. Guy Kendall,  Mrs. 
Marshall  Cook, Mrs.
Robert Barber,  Mrs.  V.T. 
Tanner,  Mrs. E.T.
Lambert,  Mrs.  Austin
Floyd, Mrs.  Lee Dunbar,  
Mrs. Austin Herman.  Mrs. 
Frankie Williams, Mrs.
Jessie Fox, Mrs. Jim
O'Grady and Mrs.  M.L. 
Vinson.

A New Version
Teacher: “ Is your mother 

or your fathc the boss in your, 
house?"

Betty: “ My daddy is the 
boss, but mommy does most of 
the talking, and that's what we
go by."

arrangment  of pink silk 
carnations with pink 
feather accents. Crystal 
appointments were used to 
serve cake, punch,  nuts 
and mints. Connie 
Manasco and Darlene 
Long assisted with the 
serving.

The hostess gift was a 
high chair.

Mrs. Austin Floyd, 
paternal grandmother of 
Brandy was a special 
guest.

The occasion was hosted 
by the Ladies of the 
Calvary Baptist Chruch.

c
Evening Service 
Noon Service

*0t-2*3-43S6

REVIVAL 
SER VICES

At
Trinity Baptist Church 

Muleshoe, Texas

Aug. 5_ 12ih
7:30 p.m. Prayer Meeting
8:00 p.m.
12:00
Evangelist:

David Kuykendall
Who is the pastor 

of tho Oakdiff 
Calvary Baptist 
Church of Dallas

Song Leader:
Marvin Lewis 

of
Amarillo, Texas

N u n ery  Will Be Provided For Each Service

Gene Prevo, Pastor
272-3301

I

1

|
1

Marvin Lewis

\
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Kristi Spies 
Shows Project 
At Houston

Miss Louise Blair, Hico; 
Mrs. Everett Renger, 
HallettsviHe; The Honor­
able Percy Hartman, 
Sinton; Mrs. Ted 
Mangum, Hungerford and 
Mrs. A.D. Cole of 
Madisonville.

Kristi Spies of Muleshoe,  
daughter of Mr. and Mrs.  
Ronnie Spies, a ttended the 
34th Annual Meeting of 
the American Cancer 
Society, Texas Division 
held at the Shamrock 
Hilton Hotel, July 18-19 in 
Houston. She was
accompanied by Pat 
Gunter.  Marilyn Young 
represented the Bailey 
County unit as a voting 
delegate.

Kristi was awarded by 
the Cancer Society at 
Levelland in April. She 
won at the Regional 
Science Fair with her 
project, “ The Effects of 
Smoking On The Blood” . 
Trish Burgess assisted her 
with the project.

Jim C. Terrell, Jr. ,  M.D.,  
of Stephenville was elected 
President of the Texas 
Division at the meeting of 
the Division Board of 
Directors. Larry K. Fuller 
of Amarillo was reelected 
to a second term as Chair­
man of the Board.

Dr. LaSalle E. Leffall, Jr. ,  
National President of the 
Society, gave the keynote 
address at the Annual 
Dinner.  Dr. Leffall is 
Professor and Chairman of 
the Department  of Surgery 
at Howard University 
College of Medicine and 
was a member  of several 
ACS foreign delegations 
including those to the 
Dominican Republic, the 
Soviet Union and the 
People’s Republic of
China.

Also elected as officers 
were Donald C. Spencer, 
M.D. of Austin, President 
-elect; Mrs.  Alton Zamzow 
of Three Rivers, Vice 
Chairman of the Board;
A. G. Schlosstein, J r . ,
Dallas, Treasurer  and
Mrs. Irene S. Wischer,  
San Antonio, Secretary.

Area Vice Presidents 
elected were; Area I, T. 
Paige Carruth,  Ph.D.,  
Canyon; Areall,  Ben Mor­
gan, Austin: Area III, D.P. 
McClure,  Corpus Christi; 
Area IV, Malcolm F. Sher, 
M.D.,  Houston; Area V, 
Jeff Nickelson, Dallas and 
Area VI, W.A. Betxel, 
Arlington.

Edward C. Hinds, M.D.,  
D.D.S. of Simonton and 
Richard H. Jesse,  M.D. of 
Houston received the 
National Divisional Award 
for their many years of 
service to the Texas Divi­
sion. The award is given 
annually in each Division 
for “ Distinguished volun­
teer leadership.”

The following volunteers 
received recognition for 
years of service to the 
ACS: 30-Year Awardees;
B.  L. Aronoff, M.D.,  
Dallas; Lewis Spears,  
formerly of Austin 
presently of Tahoka; Tom 
Regan, M.D.,  Beeville; E. 
Jackson Giles, M.D.,  
Corpus Christi; Mrs. 
Francis Huffman, Pales­
tine and Victor Gayle, 
Beaumont.

2S-Year awardees: Mrs.  
W.A. Spoonemore,
Pampa; Mrs.  Joe Hull, 
Sonora; Mrs.  Alvis 
Johnson,  Sonora: Mrs.
Ben Cusenbarry,  Sonora:

Kenneth Darren Box
A son was born to Mr. 

and Mrs.  Kenneth R. Boa 
of Muleshoe on July 28 at 
12:58 p.m. in the West 
Plains Medical Center.  
Kenneth Darren weighed 
seven pounds and five 
ounces. He has two 
brother,  Jason,  six and 
Brian, three,  and one 
sister, D’Anne, five.
Grandparents are Mr. 

and Mrs. Stan Barrett  of 
Muleshoe and Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Box of Borger.

Pre-Nuptial Shower Held 
In Honor Of Miss Franke

Patricia Vega

ATTENDED CANCEB SOCIETY MEETi Kristi Spies, 
loft, daughter  ef M r. sad M rs. Eeaale Spies, a i d  Pat 
G aater  attended the 34th Aanaal Meeting of the 
American Cancer Society, Texas Division at the 
Shamrock Hilton Hotel In Honaton. Kristi preaeatod 
her project, “ Effects of Smoking Oa the Blood”  which 
was awarded at the Cancer Socloty Regional Science 
Fair at levelland In April.

Mr. and Mrs. Fidel Vega 
of Earth are proud to 
announce the birth of a 
daughter ,  Patricia, on July 
2 8 a t 6 : 4 2 p . m . i n  the West  
Plains Medical Center.  
She weighed eight pounds 
and fifteen ounces. She 
has two sisters, Lisa, nine 
and Sandra,  five.

Grandparents are Mrs. 
Maria Morales, Earth and 
Mr. and Mrs.  Juan Vega of 
Floydada.

Victor Sierra
Mr. and Mrs. Jose Sierra 

of Muleshoe are the proud 
parents of a new baby boy 
born July 28 at 3:47 p.m. 
in the West  Plains Medical 
Center.  Victor weighed 
five pounds and fifteen 
ounces. He has two 
sisters, Virginia, four and 
Rosemary, three; and two 
brothers,  Ruben, seven 
and Jose,  five.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs.  Gregory Mata of 
Michigan and Maria 
Viargas of Mexico.

Consumer 
Food News

Best buys at Texas grocery 
markets this week include 
fryer chickens, eggs,  pork, 
frozen fish and some fresh 
produce.

Also, “ specials” appear 
on lamb, canned and 
frozen items, says Gwen- 
dolyne Clyatt, a consumer 
marketing information 
specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension 
Service, The Texas A&M 
University System.

POULTRY -  Fryer chick­
ens have high quality and 
low prices.

Egg prices dropped 
recently -• but don’t expect 
that to last long.

PORK •- attractive buys 
appear on hams.  Dicnic 
shoulder roasts and cured 
meats.  Fresh cuts at rea­
sonable prices are Boston 
butts,  chops, loin roasts

and liver.
FROZEN FOODS -  Fish 

has low prices, along with 
frozen processed potatoes,  
such as frozen french fries. 
Other specials include 
bread dough.  oot oies. 
lemonade and apple pies.

FRESH FRUITS -  Those 
with the most pleasing 
prices are bananas,  
grapes,  peaches,  necta­
rines, cantaloupe,  water ­
melons,  plums and pine­
apples.

FRESH VEGETABLES -  
Best buys include soft 
shell and zucchini squash,  
corn, several types of 
lettuce, blackeye and 
purple hull peas, potatoes,  
green onions and radishes.

Also, new potatoes have 
reasonable prices.

Prices are higher on these 
items: cabbage,  carrots 
and dry onions.
CONSUMER WATCH­

WORDS: Don’t buy any 
vegetable just because it’s 
cheap -  know quality and 
buy accordingly.

‘‘Hidden” Sugar, Fats Add Many Calories
Did you consume 102 

pounds of sugar last year? 
and not know it? Or 15 
pounds of salt?

Probably you did, says 
Mary K. Sweeten, foods 
and nutrition specialist 
with the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service, 
The Texas A&M Univer­
sity System.

Most American did -- and 
unknowingly gained
weight.

In fact, researchers say 
we're eating and drinking 
more sugar,  salt, fats and 
meat each year.

We get much more sugar 
and salt from processed 
foods and beverages,  Mrs. 
Sweeten says.

We don’t realize how 
much we’re getting, 
because we don' t  stop to 
read labels, she adds.

For example,  studies 
show that each of us 
consumed about 102 
pounds of sugar last year.

That equals about eight 
or nine pounds of Sugar 
each month -- per person.

Most of that sugar was 
syrups and sugars in 
processed foods and 
beverages.

Our dietary fat increased 
because we ate more salad 
oils and cooking oils.

What 's  the verdict on all 
this?

Not too bright, Mrs. 
Sweeten cautions.

This trend is linked to 
nutrition-related problems 
such as obesity.

Too much of any food will 
make you gain weight, the 
specialist says.

How can we fight the 
problem ?

Read labels, she says. 
Read the ingredient list­

ings and the nutrition 
information on each label, 
especialy if you're on a 
special diet or trying to 
lose weight.

To Much
Don’t worry about our 

Government being over- 
thrown-there’s too much 
of it.
-Times, Marshalltown, la.

<t>A
MEMORIAL
GIFT honors the memo­
ry of a loved one and pro­
vides hope for the living.

American Heart Association

DISMANTLING SALE

Roberts Const. Co.

Cities Service Carbonblock 

Plant No. 66
4 miles West of Seagraves, Texas 

on Hwy. 83, then one 

mile South

FOR SALE
ANGLES-CHANNELS- ROUNDS 
FIATS- TANKS- BUILDINGS 

MOTORS- CASTWHEELS

SHEETMETAL- AUGERS 

-H O P P E R S -P IP E , All 
3“ R a il-  H. P - Motore-Etc.

Everything AAust Go!!! 
Bargain Prices!!!

Ph. 806-546-2705 
All Material C O’ D* 

----  Seagraves, Tx.

Whirlpool
r  REFRIGERATOR

EDT171NKSave on this 
17.0 Cu. F t. no-frost 

refrigerator/freezer
Features you'll a p p r e c ia te  a t a  p ric e  
you've w a ite d  (or: s ep a ra te  
z e ro -d e g re e  fre e ze r, s e p a ra te  te m p  
controls for refrigerator a n d  freezer sec 
tio n s , P o w e r s a v in g  H e a te r  C o n tro l 
Switch; S u p e r-s to rag e  Doors with full- 
width shelves. Twin Crispers, much more

Our special Price. * 4 4 9 95
We have 4 trained technicians WAT 

to service your repair needs!

UH£son
117 IAIN Appliance 272-35)1

A Pre-Nuptial  Shower 
honored Miss Teresa 
Franke of San Angelo, 
bride-elect of Benny 
Hamilton of Muleshoe,  on 
July 28 from 3 to 4:30 
p.m. in the home of Mrs. 
Roy Wrinkle.
Guests were registered in 

the br ide’s book by Lisa 
Redwine.

„ The honoree was
presented with a corsage 
in her chosen colors of blue 
daisies, blue carnations 
and bows.

The serving table was 
laid with a white cloth and 
featured an ar rangement  
of blue daisies and carna­
tions with leather fern in a 
crystal vase. Teresa 
Hamilton of Muleshoe, 
sister of the prospective 
bridegroom and Brenda 
Franke, sister of the 
bride-elect of San Angelo, 
served the guests punch 
and blue thumbprint  
cookies from crystal 
appointments.

The hostess gift was a 
kitchen center.

Special guests  included 
Henrietta Franke of San

Angelo, mother of the 
bride-elect; Carelean 
Hamilton of Muleshoe,  
mother of the prospective 
bridegroom; Brenda
Franke, sister of the 
honoree of San Angelo; 
Jeanie Ware,  aunt of the 
prospective groom of 
Shallowater and Teresa 
Hamilton of Muleshoe.  
sister of the prospective 
groom.

Hostesses for the 
occasion were Mrs.  M.D. 
Locker, Mrs.  Kenneth 
Henry, Mrs.  Omer Kelton. 
Mrs.  Travis Bessire, Mrs. 
Wayne Williams, Mrs. 
C.H. Long, Mrs. W.H.  
Parker,  Mrs.  Bill Jim 
St.Clair, Mrs. Roy
Wrinkle, Mrs. Jimmie 
Skipworth, Mrs. Kenneth 
Precure,  Mrs. Ernest  
Kerr,  Mrs.  Roy Whitt,  
Mrs.  Betty Bruns, Mrs. 
Cleve Bland, Mrs. Doug 
Bales and Mrs. Don 
Harmon.

* * * *
Life's greatest achieve­

ment is a long, happy 
marriage.

M I S .  ALFONSO POSADAS

Surprise Layette Shower 
Honors Margarita Posadas

s  ■ i

ft

/
;  /

MISS T E ftSA  FIANEE

A Suprise Layette Shower 
was held in honor of Mrs. 
Alfonso (Margarita)
Posadas on July 27 from 
8:30 to 10 p.m. in the 
Catholic Center.

The honoree’s corsage 
featured baby socks with 
mint green and yellow 
streamers  and mint green 
silk carnations.  Yellow 
diapers accented the 
s t reamers.

The serving table 
featured a tree with 
miniature diapers,  candy, 
yellow bows and baby 
cards.  The table was laid 
with a yellow cloth. 
Cookies, cakes, mints, 
nuts and punch were 
served from crystal and 
silver appointments.  Elva 
Anzaldua, Elma Daniel 
and Maria Momtez
assisted with the serving.
The hostess gifts

included a baby crib, 
sheets,  blankets,  diapers 
and a stretch suit.

Hostesses were Elva 
Anzaldua, Elma Daniel, 
Amelia Madrid,  Anna
Gonzales, Lucy Lucero, 
Bianca Anzaldua, Betty
Regino, Clara Flores,

Maria Montez,  Josefina 
Cruz, Sylvia Castorena, 
Gloria Castorena, Anna 
Guterrez.  Ester Ybarra, 
Esmeralda Posadas,  Janie 
Garcia. Estela Ramos, 
Beatriz Gutierrez, Yolanda 
Bara, Gloria Cata, Connie 
Alanis, Manuela Serano, 
Teresa Peneda,  Mela 
Flores, Nelly Santos, Josie 
Baca. Pupe Guzman, 
Senaida Chavez, Maria 
Teresa Valdez, Tommy 
Lopez, Ruben Leal, Alex 
Castorena and Conchita 
Estrada.

Heart} Laugh
An old couple was listening 

to a broadcast service, the 
husband sitting back smoking 
his pipe, his wife in deep 
concentration. Half an hour 
passed in silence. Then, sud­
denly. the old man laughed.

“ Sandy," exclaimed his 
wife, "why this merriment on 
the Sabbath?"

"Ah." said Sandy, "the 
parson’s just announced the 
collection and here 1 am safe at 
home."

* * * *

Life would be simpler 
if the people on the earth

more sincere.
W -

SPECIALS BOOD 
WHILE SUPPLY LAST S! 

LIMITED SUPPLYII

WE RESERVE THE 
RIGHT TO LIMITI

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

QUALITY AID 
SAVINGS IN 
EVERY BUYI!

PRICES EFFECTIVE 
AU6UST 2-4.1979

Under New Management

, W
PORK
SRUSA6E ui. 79'

ILUHCHEOH
MEATS eu.

n i 69'

SWHTWLK/MIIIUM.R

BALLARD 1
BISCUITS tin.

C IIS

ALLOTS ASSORTED

ICE
CREAM V»l

era

$139
. ^  4 W N I R I i

^  KRISPY 
wtfr' CRACRERS m 79c

HiDri 
Paper Towels 494

Accepting Applications 
for Employment

T  RATH'S 6 J QQ
M I S ? "  5138\Rath^ LEAN m. 1
”  HHU.nau.M N. D ̂ 1 4? F’
M  KRAFT 3$1 E l  
|||dRESSIHG .T> 1
“S
i X̂WgjllRI

J S piCE23T 01IRKAY )U
■EO QTIS O ’ ̂

s  69c

I1ECU mourn (uims 0% 0% A
SHURFIHE . Q Q I i  

|jjg POP £,«J«J

Watermelons *179
(b k e 0d ^ M c td ...fo o d .

FREE! 24 oz. C O K E

WITH P U R C H A S E  OF: 
BA R-B -Q  SA N D W IC H
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Shop Muleshoe’s

Saturday,

k
s

FINAL REDUCTION 
ON SUMMER 
MERCHANDISE

r»o* •*

GOOD OLE’ 
SUMMERTIME

BARGAINS
§
*

Something Hie Fair Dept. Store
t Special0Mtn" Stcref

Beauty Salon Albertson’s
Shop For Men

ess WESTERN WEAR Lindsey Jewelry
(yt. Claims

_______ 'A
L A T R E L L ’S  F A S H IO N S  f j C W i e s ^ #

w ntjL
A N  T M O  N  > C O

I

SEE OUR 
BACK-T0-SCH001

INSERT $  
FOR

ADDITIONAL
SAVINGS.

SHIRTS §  
JACKETS 
PANTS 
TOPS 
BLOUSES 
SHOES 
SHORTS 

^  BLAZERS 
SHELLS *  
SKIRTS 
DRESSES
SANDALS *

&
Muleshoe’s Friendliest Store AND MOREIS

321 MAIN
P z i A o w r n  a o w v

MULESHOE
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IBOOKS

b a r g o M '* '

W r a n  g ' e r

j e a n s

^ r B a c k - T o - S 1

«*«tern

 ̂ashion 
J e a n s  uSIDE WALK 

SALE
_ o i o u 8 e s  

*  ManyJVfor.

Great Bargains 

Sale inside too!

2 7 2 - 5 0 ^ ^

2 0 6  M ain

iium. —

AT SIDEWALK 
SALE PRICES

■ Am .4 TH (M S

k JEANS 
CrochotVostsC h a rlie s  

Now Has
BLACK t  W 

(■ •lo  co lo
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' I U n ifo r m s  a id  p r id e
School and  team  uniform * play an  im p o rtan t ro le 

in  m any ac tiv ities fo r youth an d  keeping  thoae 
uniform a in good condition  ia neceaaary .

T his school year, m inim ize th e  tim e spen t on 
laundering  and  rep a irin g  uniform s by teach in g  
ch ild ren  th e  im portance o f  ca rin g  fo r un iform s 
them selves. They should  lea rn  th a t  th e  p ride  fe lt by 
a  good team  ap p earan ce  can  often  lead  to  good p er­
form ance also .

D uring th e  excitem ent o f  a gam e o r  even t, h a ts  
and jack e ts  a re  often  tossed a round  and  left on  the 
grass. P o in t out to  your y o u ngste rs th a t tak in g  a 
few m inutes to  pu t uniform  item s on th e  n e a re s t 
bench will no t d e tra c t from  th e ir  fun and  w ill save 
them  from  being tram pled  too.

Also have th e  ch ild ren  n eatly  pu t aw ay a ll 
c lo th ing  and  equipm ent a fte r  p rac tice  sessions and 
gam es. T his w ill help e lim inate  fran tic  m om ents 
spent looking for a  s tray  sock o r  je rsey  fo r th e  next 
big event.

'After-school' fun too
Many ch ild ren  a re  eager to  “ stay  a fte r  school” 

w hen it is to  partic ipa te  in an  ex tra -cu rricu la r 
activ ity  w ith  th e ir  friends.

W hether it is m arch ing  w ith  the  school band or 
p la y in g  a te am  S port, th e  e x t r a - c u r r ic u la r  
experience is both  im portan t and enjoyable for 
w ell-rounded schoolyeara.

Become involved in  the  y oungste r 's  after-school 
activ ities and  jo in  th e  Ain by w atch ing  them  play in 
the big gam e or tapp ing  your feet to  th e  beat o f  the 
m arching band.

Y our children  and th e ir friends w ill appreciate  
your in te res t and a tten tio n  during  th e ir grow th 
years.

Peanut butter sandwich 
is easy, nutritious too

s *  r T  a i l

Sandwiches are "on the 
go” foods and one of the most 
traveled of all is the peanut 
butter sandwich for which 
there are several reasons.

Peanut butter is a top 
flavor favorite and keeps 
well even in a simple brown 
bag, besides being easy to fix.

One of the routes for 
millions of peanut butter 
sandwiches again this year 
is "back to school” since 
most anyone can pack a 
peanut butter sandwich bag 
lunch including dads, moms, 
or one of the school kids.

Along with the sandwich, 
a piece of fruit such as an 
orange, apple or banana

Read to children

AUSTIN, Texas (Spl ) — If 
Johnny has trouble reading, 
chances are his folks don't 
read at home, says a Universi­
ty of Texas assistant pro­
fessor of curriculum and in­
struction

"If the parents don't read at 
home, whether they can read 
or not," says Dr Walter 
Lamberg, "there's no model 
for the children to read " But 
he adds "if there is a good 
positive model, children will 
start, well before school, do­
ing things that are associated 
with reading and that prepare 
them to read."

In a similar vein, one of his 
co l leagues .  Dr Frank 
Guszak, suggests that being 
read to is an important step in 
teaching a young child to 
read Children who are read 
to, Dr Guszak says, are ones 
who seem to succeed in 
reading

Snacks by 
busy moms

for 'after 
school'time

With more and more 
mothers working, attending 
classes at the local college 
and  part ic ipa t ing  in a 
v a r i e t y  of  c o m m u n i t y  
projects, there is a good 
chance that many children 
will be making their own 
"after school” snacks.

A t radi t ion  in many 
American homes, the after­
school snack  perks up 
youngsters after the long day 
at school and helps tide them 
over until dinner time.

With a bit of pre planning, 
a busy woman can supervise 
her children's snack time 
even when she is not present. 
Here are some suggestions to 
consider:

Rather than leave the 
mixing and pouring of foods 
and liquids up to your young 
children, prepare all snacks 
the night before. Youngsters 
will enjoy looking in the 
refrigerator and finding 
individual portions of fresh 
or canned fruit, vegetable 
sticks or creamy pudding in

colorful bowls waiting for 
them.

If you buy milk or fruit 
juice in large heavy con­
tainers or in glass bottles, 
pour individual cups ahead 
of time and place covered on 
a refrigerator shelf that the 
children can reach easily.

To prevent  p o te n t ia l  
accidents, leave the chil­
dren's snacks and beverages 
in paper plates and cups 
instead of glassware This 
will also eliminate having a 
sinkful  of di r ty  dishes 
awaiting your return.

(a l ready  wrapped in a 
natural cover) and a dessert 
treat from the cookie jar can 
go into the lunchbag. When a 
container of milk is added at 
lunchtime, the meal rates a 
nutritionist's gold star.

A sandwich made with two 
slices of enriched bread 
spread with two tablespoons 
of peanut butter will provide 
a child with 30% of the day’s 
Recommended Dietary Al­
lowance of protein. 40% of 
the niacin and 15% of the 
iron.

So be glad for peanut 
butter sandwiches. They are 
easy, quick and nutritious.

Nev«r too old I

AUSTIN, Texas (Spl ) -  
One is never too old to learn. 
The University of Texas is 
finding

Since fall 1976, enrollment 
of persons 25 years or older 
has increased 27 per cent on 
the UT Austin capipus, accor­
ding to Dr David E Hershey, 
director of admissions and 
records

Older-than-average stu­
dents attending the University 
include 4.035 undergraduates 
and 6,109 graduate students 
The Dean of Students Office 
has a special counselor for 
older-than-average students

L ay e re d  lo o k  
is fa s h io n a b le  
fo r  a ll ag es

The layered look for school 
f a s h i o n s  is no t  on ly 
appropriate for the season 
but economical for students 
on limited budgets.

Modernize last  year ' s  
dirndl skirt and sweater with 
a new unstructured blazer or 
add style to a roll-sleeve 
blouse with a quilted vest

Match slim-fitting jeans 
and corduroy slacks from 
last season with a new loose 
fitting sweater that slims 
down at the waist for a 
coordinated effect.

t f G l t f W  f 0 R
S C H O G L

A U G . 2 7 .

WOMEN AND COLLECt
A recent Census Bureau 

survey found that women com­
prised 52 percent of all college 
students under age 22, and 
older women are the fastest 
growing group in college at­
tendance. In 1%8, men out­
numbered women. 4.5 million 
to 3 million.

ImmuDization 
Is Required 
For Students

Neal B. Dillman, super in­
tendent of the Muleshoe 
schools, announces that 
school will be starting 
soon, on Wednesday,  
August  29, and many 
children will have to be 
immunized against certain 
diseases,  particularly
those children entering 
school for the first time.

According the the Texas 
School Immunization Law, 
the following immuniza­
tions must be given before 
a child may enter public 
shcool:
(1) Diptheria-Tetanus — 
three doses required with 
the last dose since the 
fourth birthday.

(2) Oral Polio — three 
doses required, with the 
last dose since the fourth 
birthday.

(3) Red measles -• one 
dose since the first birth­
day, or a doctor's s tate­
ment of disease.

(4) German measles -• 
one dose of vaccine.

(5) Mumps -- one dose of 
vaccine or a doctor's s tate­
ment of disease,  required 
for first graders or below.

The superintendent
reminded that your family 
doctor can immunize your 
child, or you may go to the 
health depar tment  at 306 
W est Second Street.

Kindergarten age  
need supplies too

Befors sending tots off to 
nursery school or kinder­
garten pay as much attention 
to outfitting them for school as 
you would your older children.

If your child will be toting 
his or her own lunch to school, 
let the child help select their 
own lunch pail as it will 
increase the pleasure of its 
use. You may find that pre­
packaged moist towelettes will 
encourage children to clean 
their hands after eating.

Of course there will be 
school supplies to purchase too 
and extras might be helphil to 
create a young child's own 
craft corner for after-school 
fun and education. For the 
crafts corner include clay, 
finger paint* and suitable 
drawing or painting paper.

When buying scissors far a 
young child select those with

rounded ends for the child's 
safety, until they learn to work 
with sharper instruments.

Select a collection of pencil* 
and magic markers in bright 
colors and a box of crayons 
along with enough construc­
tion paper to get them started 
on a multitude of projects.

Teens like 
jean look
Remember when jeans were 

worn by only farmers and 
handymen?

T od ay ,  j e a n s  a r e  an  
international uniform with 
jackets, skirts, shirts of denim 
being the new status symbol.

Denim reflects the life style 
of the '70s and are attire for 
most occasions encountered 
by youth.

Cobb’s
Sidewalk Sale

have Great 
Back-To-School Buys
Girl’s Pants & Tops 

Boy’s Shirts & Pants

Ladies Sportswear 
M en’s Shirts & Pants

INSIDE

SHON4 K K  272 345* 

131* W EST A M ER IC A N  H .VD  

M U tH H Q I TEXAS 79347

T-shirts fashionable now
T -s h ir ta  a re  no  lo n g e r  m ere  u n d e rg a rm e n ts  to  be 

tu ck ed  to w a rd  th e  back  o f  th e  bedroom  d re a a e r  o r  
w o rn  ou t o f  s ig h t.

T o d ay 's  T -sh ir ta  a re  m e ssag e  c a r r ie r s  an d  a re  
very  co m fo rta b le  fo r  a ll ag e s  an d  bo th  sexes. T he 
w e a re r  can  d e c la re  a lle g ia n c e  to  a rock  band , 
p ro c la im  th e ir  hobby  o r  ju s t o ffe r  a h um orous 
com m en t to  th e  w orld .

T he now  fa sh io n a b le  T -s h ir t  w ith  a ll its  
p ro c la m a tio n s  h as  a rea d y  line o f  ac c e sso rie s  fo r a 
m ix -o r-m atch  w a rd ro b e . E v e ry th in g  h a s  been 
d es ig n ed  to  m ak e  su re  th a t  th e  o n ce  low ly T -s h ir t  
w o n ’t be s ta n d in g  a lo n e  a t  w h a t is now  th e  p ea k  o f  
th e  fa sh io n  scene.

Latrell's
Fashions

fo r
Back-To-School

Tops

YoY A <°.v.
2 0 %  o h

+
Socks & Tights 
Panties &  Slips

20% off
*4*

1/2 of 1/2

r

on

Girls & Pre - Teen 
Summer Shorts 

& Tops

ATRELL’S FASHION

Oxfords
‘ SIZE 8 1/2-3 
‘ JUMPING JACKS 
‘ REG. $14.00 And $18.00

Sidewalk 
j Sale
|For Great 
j Bargains
\ at 
Give Away 

Prices!!

m i n i s
MEN 'S CORDUROY

Jeans
‘ POLYESTER-COTTON 
‘MACHINE WASHABLE 
‘ FLARE LEGS 
‘TAN-BROWN-RUST

BOYS OR GIRLS
*1199

Gym Shorts
‘ POLYESTER KNITS 
‘ SIZES XXS To L 
‘ BLACK-WHITE- 

ORANGE-GREEN

‘ INITIALS FREE £

NYLON

Panties
‘NYLON HIP HUGGER 

l‘WHITE, ASSORTED PASTELS 
'GIRLS AND LADIES SIZES

•  J 5 5

&
•  ] 8 5

1910 I .  Atrer. Blvd. Muleshoe 172-4449

JUNIOR
POLYESTER GABERDINE

PANTS
‘2-WAY STRETCH
‘ FLY FRONT-BELTED WAIST
‘ REG. $15.00

272-4453

“You’ve Tried The Rest, 

Now Try The Bent”St flak’

fe d q e H l_
With the Built-in Edge7

Jeans
★  100% Colton ★  Flare-Big Bells

★  size 6-14 Slims
★  Values to*14*

»9*8

110 Main
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R Construction
272-3758 Or 272-4347

Call About Our CuMonr /  
Or FmHA Homes In

We’d Like to
Introduce
Ourselves...

As the new authorized National Homes 

txjilder in this area. We offer a wide 
variety of homes styles and designs to 
suit your needs. Our homes are built 
with name brand materials, enetgy-sav 
ing insulation features and are the best 
structurally engineered homes you can 
buy. Stop by or give us a call'toddy'

POTATOES BEING WA SH ED -A t  Barrett  Produce, southeast  • (  Malcahoc aa
Highway 84, hage trackloada of patatoea arc arriving constantly with the potato 
harvcat well underway.  In the background,  large piper waah the potatoes before they 
are coaveyed laelde the plaat  for eortlug and packing.

910,000 ...
Cont from Page 1

Portales, sought to substi­
tute a property bond for 
the cash bond.

" W h e n  he said he
wanted his money back, I 
told him and his parents 
that 1 had already spent it, 
as a joke,”  the 71-year old

sheriff recalled.
But the jokes ended when 

he discovered that the cash 
bond had never been 
deposited in the bank.

Clements,  who has been 
the Bailey County sheriff 
for 23 years, said he 
double checked the depar t ­
ment vault, but couldn’t 
find the money. He said he

YAC...
Cont from Page 1

minutes showed, he could 
negotiage the rates when 
the building is used.

However,  an attorney had 
said that even though the 
manager said a lower rate 
could be paid, that as long 
as the $50 charge 
remained in the commiss­
ioner’s court minutes, 
commissioners could come 
back at any point in time 
and demand the balance of 
the payment  from YAC.

Another at tempt  will be 
made to have Sunday 
skating. It will be 2-5 p.m. 
at the coliseum. If enough 
funds cannot be made, the 
Sunday skating will have 
to be discountinued. 
according to a YAC 
spokesm an.

Ricky Mata met with the 
group to ask their support 
to receive a $1,242 federal 
grant  for use in Muleshoe 
for scouting and
recreation. Although YAC 
indicated no interest in 
receiving the funds for 
themselves,  they did 
support the funds being 
acquired.

. . .  *
Never expect good 

luck to make up for loaf­
ing.

also checked with District 
Clerk Nelda Merriott to 
see if anyone had left the 
$10,000 with her. They 
h a d n ’t.

The sheriff said he 
accepts responsibility for 
the loss of the money. He 
already has paid $6,000 
from his own funds to Gary 
Hahn,  and he plans to 
reimburse an additional 
$4,000 if the cashier ’s 
check is ever cashed.

The cash bond had been 
made by Hahn on April 18, 
1978. Hahn was arrested 
and jailed as part of an 
alleged Texas-New Mexico 
methamphetamine  con­
spiracy that brought 
indictments against  30 
people.

The bond was made to 
Chief Deputy Bud Street. 
Sheriff Clements had 
entered the hospital earlier 
that April for a series of 
operations that would 
sideline him for work for 
most of the next year.

Depar tment  procedure 
calls for bonds of under 
$1,000 to be kept in the 
vault, and for bonds of 
more thatn $1,000 to be 
deposited in the sheriff 's 
department  bank account.

The Hahn bond, how­
ever, was accepted by the 
chief deputy,  placed in the 
vault, but never
transferred to the bank, 
the sheriff said.

And sometime between 
the time the bond was 
made and when Hahn 
asked for his money back, 
if disappeared from the 
vault.

Clements said he believes 
the money has been 
‘‘misplaced” or accident­
ally deposited in another 
county bank account.

"Almost  anything in the 
world could have
happened to i t ,” he said. 
"I t  might  have been lost or 
thrown away.”

The sheriff said only two 
persons have access to the 
vault-himself and the chief 
deputy.  Bud Street, who is 
now the county probation 
officer, was succeeded as 
chief deputy last year by

Bob Henderson.
Street,  Henderson and 

the sheriff’s other two 
deputies have passed lie 
detector tests concerning 
the missing money, the 
sheriff said.

The sheriff is conducting 
his own in-house invest­
igation of the incident. A 
spokesman in District 
Attorney Jack Young's 
office said the district 
attorney does not plan to 
investigate the missing 
cash bond.
We' re  not looking at this 
as a criminal case ,”  the 
spokesman said, " w e ’re 

thinking that the money 
has only been misplaced.” 

County Judge  Glen 
Williams said th sheriff 
has not asked for any help 
from the commissioners.

"This  is a loss the sheriff 
will have to suf fer ,"  
Williams said. " I t ’s his 
mistake. He hasn' t  asked 
us to replace the.phoney, 
and I'm sure n„we- 
wouldn’t . ”

The loss of the money 
may result in a change in 
the county's bond hand ­
ling procedure.In Lubbock 
County, for instance, 
bonds are paid directly to 
the district clerk.

Since the $10,000 was 
reported missing, two 
attorneys have delivered 
large cash bonds directly 
to the Bailey County 
district clerk instead of to

the sheriff 's office.
Sheriff Clements recalled 

an episode several years 
ago when $360 belonged 
to a captured illegal alien 
disappeared from the jail.

“ I decided I was going to 
find out who took that 
money,”  Clements said.

A few days after the 
sheriff began his investi­
gation, he said he received 
the stolen money through 

ma i l ____________________ _

Rotariam ...
-out from Page |

" T h e  city has never 
charged extra for provid­
ing police protection for 
events conducted at the 
coliseum.
It is our thought  that all 

money genera ted in the 
city, including at the 
coliseum, goes back into 
the comrauoity and is 
spent here.  Our officers 
ivill continue to provid^ 
protection as they always 
have.”
He also said that for the 

vrestl ing, the Rotary Club 
would be charged $75, 
plus 10 percent  of the net 
profit. He also had no 
inswer as to whether or 
sot the newly increased

Wreitling...
Coot from Page 1

Mexico's Carlos Mata,  in 
what should be a fast and 
scientific mat<4i. Both men 
are junior heavyweights 
and and have rough-and 
- tumbled with the best of 
the big boys.

Completing the card will 
be Alex " T h e  Texican” 
Perez, a 253 pound former 
fistic great  from Lelia 
Lake. He will meet  Tommy 
Sharp in the opener.  
Sharp, from St. Joseph,  
Mo.,  weighs 225.

Be sure to make your 
plans to attend the 
Rotary-sponsored event 
Saturday night.

Wrecks...
Coal from Page 1

an intersection of a paved 
county road and a dirt road 
7.1 miles west of Mule-
shoe.

Driver and sole occupant 
of one of the vehicles, Joe 
Rodriguez, was taken to 
West  Plains Medical 
Center  by ambulance for 
t reatment  of a shoulder 
and facial injuries. He was 
eastbound on the county 
paved road.

Pedro Aranda,  driver of 
the car, was northbound 
on the county dirt road 
when the collision 
occurred. No injuries were 
reported from the Aranda 
vehicle. It was investi­
gated by DPS Troopers 
Jim Dulin and Paul 
Hernandez.

Last Friday night around 
midnight,  Monty Jones,  
driver of a late model car 
received injuries in an 
accident involving a black 
bull owned by Clayton 
Myers.
The accident was some 

two miles northwest of 
Muleshoe on Highway 84. 
a passenger in the Jones 
vehicle received lesser 
injuries. Jones was
hospitalized overnight for 
observat ion.

Mrs.  Myers said the bull 
was removed from the 
accident,  then butchered 
as it received a broken leg 
in the accident and could 
not be saved.

Investigating officer was 
DPS Trooper Paul
Hernandez.

price would include 
clean-up of the building.

Black toU Rotary Club in 
additon that  aervice clubs 
were informed when the 
Coliseum opened that they 

* would be charged $60 per 
Umonth for meeting one 

hour in the building each 
week. This included 
charges for both the 
kitchen and meeting room. 
However,  he cited 
increased prices for 
utilities as the reason for 
the increase in price to $75

City Sponsors 
Four Firemen 
For Training

Last week, five members 
of the Muleshoe Fire 
Depar tment at tended fire 
training school at Texas 
AdcM University. This was 
the 50th annual  Texas 
F ireman 's  Training
School.

The city of M uleshoe, at a 
cost of some $500 each, 
sponsored Alton Parker,  
Jack Rennels,  Owen Jones 
and J ames  ' S m o k e y ' M a r ­
tin to at tend the one week 
session. Also at tending,  
sponsored by Bailey 
County Farm Bureau, was 
Wayland Harris.

Some 1,820 students 
represented  728 cities 
from 32 states in the 
school.

Courses at tended
included Fire Fighting, 
Fire Prevention, Fire 
Depar tment Officer Train­
ing, Fire Department  
Pump Maintenance,
Specialiazed Fire Protec­
tion, and Disaster Rescue

Training.
Each year,  at least five 

firemen are sent to A&M 
to attend the special fire 
schooling.

School Board 
Studies Forms 
For Application

Two special sessions of 
the school board members  
for the Muleshoe indepen­
dent School District were 
conducted this week. ■■ o", 

During a meeting Mog- 
day night, board members 
agreed to ask Robert Ash­
worth of Amarillo, to act as 
consultant during the time 
the school board is receiv­
ing applications to employ 
a new super intendent  of 
schools.

Board members  also 
studied various forms for 
applications, contracts and 
other necessary paper 
work.

Wednesday night, board 
members  scheduled anot­
her meeting with the 
consultant,  and planned to 
discuss methods and 
guidelines to be used in 
selecting the new super in­
tendent.

Applications will be 
accepted, beginning Sept ­
ember  1, for a new super ­
intendent  to replace 
current  superintendent ,  
Neal B. Dillman, who will 
retire January 31, 1980.

growing proof 
of the 
boosting
power of 
Na-Churs 
Foliar
Feeding

On 
On profits.

Your NA-CHURS Representative has the 
details. Look for him to be calling soon -  or 
contact him
NA-CHURS Foliar Feeding is a proven way to 
boost your crops to bigger and better yields

Contact: Ron Kidd 
Mobile: 965-2374 
Hon e: 272-3705

NA-CHURS

.

v ' t f V -
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per month.
He said organizations 

having functions at the 
coliseum would be 
responsible for picking up

Big Community 
Wide Revival 
Is Underway

A large non-denomina- 
t ional/com m unity • wide 
revival got underway in 
Muleshoe Tuesday night, 
July 31, with evening 
services scheduled
through Saturday.  August  
4. Services are being 
conducted nightly at the 
American Legion building 
on West  Avenue B, with 
services scheduled for 8 
p . m . each evening. 

Conducting the revival 
services is Rev. Israel 
Leon, who is said to be a 
Mexican evangelist  from 
Cardenas,  Tabasco,
M exico.

A spokesman said Rev. 
Leon has been preaching 
for the last 17 years,  and 
has traveled extensively as 
he preaches the word of 
Gospel to different people.

Rev. Leon is an ordained 
minister who works in the 
Charismatic Movement  
and he also is a minister in 
the Full Gospel M e n ’s 
Fellowship.

A Spokesman com­
mented ,  “ God spoke to 
Rev. Leon to come to 
Muleshoe to be a blessing 
to everyone, and we want 
to welcome everyone to the 
me et ings .”

Rain,..
Cont from Page 1

Highways and Public 
Transportat ion in Mule­
shoe was called out 
because of water across 
highways both on Monday 
and Tuesday night.

Stanley Burreson said the 
most water  was north of 
Sudan on FM303 to the 
Dodd community,  with 
heavy water reported in a 
two mile strip from the 
Nickels Gin, five miles 
west of Earth Northward 
across the paved road.

He said a lot of water  had 
been reported in Parmer 
County oij, the preceding 
night.  j

In the meant ime,  the 
national Weather  Service 
predicted the same type 
weather would continue 
through today (Thursday) 
with the chance of 
additional thunderstorms 
and possible isolated 
flooding and high wind in 
and around the thun de r ­
storms.  Temperature  was 
expected to be in the high 
80s to low 90s.

paper,  cupi ,  and wiping 
up spills, and that  the 
janitor would do the real. 
He said, “ it takes 8 to 16 
hours to put a building 
back into shape after an 
evea t  has been conducted 
at the col iseum.”

The coliseum manager  
also said the regularly 
hired janitor will do the 
clean-up for a small fee.

Following another
question, he est imated 
that the coliseum arena is 
used seven nights per 
month,  and did not directly 
respond to a question on 
what is being done to 
induce other groups to 
utilize the facility, he did 
say an at tempt is being 
made to perhaps have 
some country-western 
shows, or other events at 
the coliseum.

When asked why he, or 
commissioners’ court had 
not consulted with any 
group before the new rates 
were voted into effect on 
July 11, Black said he had 
been at tempting to contact 
the members  of the 
organizations involved on 
a ‘one-to-one’ basis.

He presented and 
undated,  carbon copy of a 
letter which he said he had 
mailed the original to 
Harmon Elliott, chairman 
of the wrestling project. 
Elliott said he had received 
no such letter.

Black also suggested that 
members  of all civic clubs 
and other organizations 
meet  with the commiss­
ioners'  court at 11 a.m. 
today (Thursday) to 
discuss the proposed

Local Lions

Club Planning 
Broom Salo

On Wednesday,  August  
22, the Muleshoe Lions 
Club will conduct their 
annual broom sale on the 
parking lot of Muleshoe 
State Bank.

Lions President  Dr. Jerry 
Redwine suggests  that 
persons make their plans 
to attend the broom sale 
and purchase the brooms, 
brushes and other house­
hold items needed at that 
t i m e I *  i -i J i H u t  

He reminded that money 
received from the sale will 
be used for local projects, 
with the major portion of 
the money being used for 
the benefit of the blind and 
visually handicapped per ­
sons.

Mark your calendar for 
W ednesday,  August  22, go 
to the bank parking lot and 
look over the available 
merchandise and choose 
your items to purchase.

changes.  Although he 
suggested two members 
from each organizatioa, 
other  sources said a|l 
persons who use the 
coliseum need to be repre­
sented.

He also did not answer 
why only four groups were 
singled out for the price 
change,  and said the 
prices would ‘be negoti­
ab le . ’ This s tatement  was 
also openended,  as he was 
not specific in what way 
the charges would be 
‘negot ibsle. ’

• • *  *

Accuracy-in speaking 
and listening-is the rarest 
of traits.

*  *  • *

The test of the Egyp­
tian-Israeli peace accord 
is whether it brings peace 
or war-and whether a war 
would involve the U.S.

REBATES5 2,500 
LEASES7.50
Buying a Valley irrigation system this summer could be 
the smartest thing you could do all this year We are 
offering you a choice of either big rebates or long-term 
leases at rates that are hard to believe On Valley 
Imears and corners the rebates are as high as 
$2,500 On regular systems rebates are as high as 
$1,250 You save the most by acting now, not Taler, 
because rebates decline in value after August 17th

For Valley linears and corners, make a 10% down 
payment We ll put the system on your farm and you 
won f have to make the next payment until January. 
1981! The lease rate is an unbelievable 7 50%  in 
July and goes to 7.63% on August 17th You can make 
about the same deal on a regular system and the rate 
is 8 64%. If you don t want the January, 1981 second 
payment plan, the rate is 8 24%  We even have 
an interest tree finance plan to January, 1980 See  
your Valley dealer, he has all the facts

If you wait, you're losing money.

rVALuy
American Valley Inc.

Muleshoe, Tx.

W. Hwy. 84 ph. 272-4266
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DS
Deadlia* For Classified Ads Is 

Taesdays Aid Fridays
11:00

CLASSIFIED RATES 
1*1 In.ertlon, 

per word —$.11 
Minimum Charge

$1.80

2nd Insertion, 
and thereafter 
per word — $.09 

Minimum Charge
S1.S0

CARD OFTHANKS 
25 word. - $3.00 

Over 25 worda 
charged at regnlar 

classified rates 
Classified Display — 

$1.55 per column Inch 
Doable Rate for 

Blind Ads. 
DEADLINE FOR 

INSERTION 
11 a.m . Tnes. for Thnra.

11 a.m. Ftl. for San. 
WE RESERVE THE 
RIGHT TO CLASSIFY, 
REVISE OR REJECT 
ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 
AFTER AD HAS RUN 
ONCE.

• 4 *****«oo*oso* ooooooooo*V*2

8. REAL ESTATE

1. PERSONALS
•**•*•••*•*.**••****»**•**»»

WE BUY
USED FURNITURE ft 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE
1- 18 s-tfc

2. LOST AND FOUND

$100.00 REWARD
OFFERED for the return 
or information leading to 
the return of male 
Australian Shepherd dog 
taken from 1 mile north of 
M uleshoe.
Call 272-4291 or 272-4027
2- 28s-t>tp

3. HELP WANTED

STEERE TANKLINE in
Dimmitt,  Texas is now 
accepting applications for 
experienced semi drivers. 
One year experience in the 
last three necessary. 
Please apply in person. 
We are an equal opportu­
nity employer.
Call 647-3163.
Don Burris
3- 28t-8tc

HELP WANTED: John 
Deer.  Parts depar tment  
personel.  Life and Health 
Insurance paid, vacation 
paid and uniforms. Call 
[806] 257-3421, Ronnie 
Dent,  Earth.
3-26t-tfc

THE MANPOWER
DIVISION of South Plains 
Community Action
Association, Inc. is
currently accepting
applications for the 
position of the Migrant 
Outreach Worker.
Interested Persons should 
contact Carmen Kirvan, 
272-3647 for application 
and information. Deadline 
for acceptance of applica­
tions will be Aug. 3. 
Affirmative Action, Equal 
Opportunity Employer. 
3-30t-4tc

WANTED: D.E. Student,  
part time through summer  
& school term. Apply in 
person at the M uleshoe 
Publishing co.

HELP WANTED: Need 
someone to set pipe, 4 
lines a day. $5.00 a line 
with own transportation, 
$4.00 a line if t ransporta­
tion Furnished.
Call 272-3277 
3-30s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath,  Kitchen-den combi­
nation, seperate living- 
room, fenced backyard, 
storage house. Complete 
redecoration 3 years ago. 
1912 W. Ave. F. Call 
272-3041 after 5 p .m . or 
272-4511 daytime for Jim 
Bargees.
8-31 t-8tc

BEAUTIFUL NEW 
HOME FOR SALE

1625 W. Ave. J ,  ceramin 
tile entry, large living - 
dining room, kitchen - 
breakfast ,  den 3 large 
bedrooms and 2 full baths,  
fireplace, bookcases,
arches,  Amana self clean 
cerema top stove - oven, 
large patio, plus other 
features too numerous to 
list. For appointment call 
272-3183.
8-13s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 
brick house, across from 
Richland Hills School. 272- 
4391.
8-23s-tfc

For all your real estate 
Call:

GLAZE ft GOFORTH 
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

8-lls-tfc

IF YOU MAKE $16,000 or 
less a year and have a good 
credit rating you can quali­
fy for a new FmHa home. 
Contact JAR Conatrnctlon 
about their FmHa approv­
ed homes. Call 272-3758 or 
272-4347.
8-50s-tfc

FOR SALE: 1 acre. 2 
houses,  storage house and 
shed for stock. Call Dorine 
Harbin at 272-5595 
8-30s-2tp

ROBERT RICHARDS 
REAL ESTATE 
111 W. Ave. B 

272-4581
2 bedroom, fully carpeted, 
attached carport. Priced to 
sale

U \c n n z t ( i  c ^ f z n x y
Equal Honalng 

Opportunity 
272-4228

8-16s-tfc

KREBBS
REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C 
Ph. 272-3191 

All Yonr Real Estate 
Needs.

APPRAISALS

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE

232 Main
For complete Real Estate 
Service contact Joe or 
Ricky Smallwood 272-4838
8-30s-tfc

FOR SALE: 14X72 Ulti­
mate Mobile Home, 
Masonite siding, skirting, 
porch, all appliances, 
washer and dryer, storm 
windows, low equity and 
assume loan. Call 272-5151 
from 9 to 5. After 6 p .m . 
call 385-3124.
8-30s-tfc

We want yonr bnolnesa 
“ REMEMBER”  

REID REAL ESTATE 
THURSIE REID 

272-3142
8-30t-ttfc

FOR SALE: New 3 bed­
room brick home, I car 
garage.  2 bath, fence. 
$39,500.00 J ft R Constr­
uction. Phone 272-4347 or

................................................... 272-3758.
WANTED: Ladies who 8-25t-tfc
sew, embrodiery or knit..........................................................
full time or part time. Call FOR SALE: 3 bedroom 
CHARLIES 272-5180 brick house, den and fire-
3- 30s-tfc place. l ‘/> acres of land.
................................................... House ALL carpeted.  Call

272-4119 after 8p .m .

4. HOUSES FOR RENT ...................................................
HOUSE FOR SALE: Rich-

................................................... land Hills • 3 bedroom - 2
FOR RENT: 3 bedroom, 2 bath,  livingroom, den, din- 
bath brick house. Call ing room. Refrigerated air- 
272-3029. 1922 sq. ft., 1733 W. Ave.
4- 31 t-4tc B, Call 272-4811 or 272-
...................................................  4661.
...................................................  8-23s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 
1 3/4 baths,  large family 
room. 903 W. 8th. call 
272-3235

8-25t-tfc

9 F 1
udderth  R ealty, In a

Bo« 627 -  109 bin St 
Farvrtlt, T««« 79326 

PfuNW (8061 481 3298 o, 491 9149

160 acres North of Pro­
gress,  good water area,  1 
well, priced to sell.

160 Acres northwest of 
Muleshoe,  2 wells, lays 
good, on FM highway.

160 Acres near Nichols 
Gin, 1‘/: miles north of 
Highway 70. Good water 
area,  lays good.

West of Muleshoe-AII on 
2 acres, beautiful 3 b ed ­
room, 2 bath brick home, 
double garage.  Lots of 
storage and small good 3 ' 
bedroom, 1 bath house. 
Lost of extras and 
additional double garage 
and corral.

Lovely 2 bedroom coun­
try home, on highway 
west of Lariat. On appro­
ximately 1 acre. See to 
appreciate.
8-25s-tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE: Newly 
decorated, carpeted,
newly painted on outside 
and trimmed. Sets on two 
large lots. $20,000.00 519 
E. 4th.
Call 946-3613
8-27s-10tc

H I G H W A Y  2  14  N O R T H

M U L E S H O E .  T E X A S

TOWN and 

COUNTRYlR E A L  E S T A T E
50 x 140 ft. Commercial 
building, downtown.

18 Acres on highway east 
of town. Two wells and 
no improvements.

20 Acres east of town 
with 1 domestic well and 
no other improvements.

8 Acres north of town.

We have several 1 Acre 
home cites 3 miles east of 
town, some O.K. for 
mobile homes
Two - 3 bedroom bricks 
with double garages in 
Country Club Addition.

If you want ACTION list 
your property with us

FARMS RANCHES HOMES

JOHN W. SMITH,

Broker
806-272-4678

or
272-4307

8-29s-tfc

HOME FOR SALE:3 b e d ­
room, 1 y« bath,  fully 
carpeted, gas grill, storage 
building. $33,000.00 Call 
272-4754 
8-26s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath brick home, choice 
location, corner lot, fenced 
backyard, fruit trees,  
central heat,  built in 
dishwasher,  fully carpeted 
new evaporative cooler. 
801 West 9th, phone 
272-4367.
8 27s-tfc

9. AUTOMOBILES FOR SALE

FOR SALE: 1976 GMC 
Siera Classic pickup, 
clean, loaded. Two gas 
tanks.  Also camper,  
$4,200.00 Can be seen at 
602 S. 1st. Street or Call 
272-4371.
9- 30t-4tp

10. FARM EQUIP. FOR SALE

FOR SALE:Portable GT
Tox-O-Wik, model 570 
grain dryer. PTP drive, 
LPG. Two years old, never 
used. 6-12 volt, bought 
new in 1976 never used. 
Phone 272-5536.
10- 27s-tfc

FOR SALE: One Interna­
tional 550 Ensilage cutter 
with 2 row head, $1750.00.

WOOLEY-HURST
272-5514
10- 30s-2tc

*?***•**•«•*•••*•**••••*•«••
11. FOR SALE OR TRADE
***t***t*tt***t******ft***ft»*

FOR SALE: 17 ft. Stern- 
craft, walk thru, 135 H 
Mercury with power tilt. 
Phone 272-3661, 1718 W. 
Ave. E.
11- 31 t-8tp

FOR SALE: REGISTERED 
PAINT FILLIE AMERI­
CAN PAINT HORSE 
ASSOCIATION.
16 months,  colored just 
right. Great conformation. 
Call [505] 487-2831, Logan 
, N .M .
11-31 t-8tc

FOR SALE: 1976 Hodaka 
100 CC trail bike ideal for 
young riders. $400. 3 rail 
big wheeled trailer, excel­
lent rubber,  $300. Call 
Todd Allison 272-4789 or 
see at 611 West Third. 
11-31 t-2tp

FOR SALE:14 foot Texas 
made boat and trailer with 
35 HP Evenrude motor. 
Call 965-2658 or 965-2115 
1 l-29s-8tc
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • a *
12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

Large selection new and 
used quality furniture and 
appliances.  Use our easy 
pay plan.
DISCOUNT FURNITURE 

7th & Prince
Ph: 769-0887 Clovis, N.M.
12-311-1tc

BURROWS UPHOLSTER­
ING* new address,  118 W. 
Ave. C in the rear. Phone 
272-4255
12-39s-tfc
•*****•*•**••*•*•••****«•**«
15. MISCELLANEOUS

BARGAIN
Advance 14 Hybrid Grain 
Sorghum, dryland or irri­
gated. Medium to late 
maturity. Can be seen at 
the Ranch House Motel. 
15-21 s-tfc

FOR SALE: COOKWARE 
- WATERLESS. Home, 
demostration Kind. Still in 
Box. $185.00. Normally. 
$499. Call 1-303-591.1331.
1 5-31 t-8tp

Custom Designed 
and

Made-To-Order 
RINGS-N-THINGS 

BY JEROLLY
918 E Hickory

Phone 272-3163

Library
News

By Anna Camp

Memorial  gifts have been 
an important part of the 
Library collection from the 
time they began in 1963. 
Many, many good books 
are on the shelves with a 
Memorial  plaque denoting 
they were given in loving 
memory of someone. The 
library welcomes your 
memorial  gifts.
Recent contributions to 

the Memorial  Library 
Fund in memory of Mrs. 
Frances Graham,  Lois & 
Julian Lenau, Inez ft Pat 
Bobo and the Jack Young 
Family; in memory of Mrs. 
Jean Lovelady, Mr. & 
Mrs. W.R. Lee, Anne & 
Bernis Camp, Walter & 
Marie Boness and Mrs. 
Zed Robinson; in memory 
of Mrs.  Lula Gorrell, Anne 
& Bernis Camp and Marie 
& Charles Lenau; in 
memory of Mrs.  Ardath 
Glasscock, Mr. ft Mrs. 
Paul Stout, M ychelle, 
Natalie ft Barbie; in 
memory of Mrs.  Adella 
Rockey, Mildred Davis; in 
memory of Mrs. Lula A. 
Kistler, Pat ft Inez Bobo, 
Cleta Williams. Glenna 
Raney, ft Hazel Cunning­
ham, Mr. ft Mrs. O.D. Ray 
ft Dixon, Mr. ft Mrs. 
Bernis Camp, Marie ft 
Charles Lenau and
Mildred Davis; in memory 
of Mrs.  Ellen Sparkman, 
Mrs.  Arthur Crow; in 
memory of N.A. Dunlap, 
Mr. & Mrs. Ken Angeley 
and Mr. and Mrs. Morgan 
Locker; in memory of Roy 
D. Montgomery,  the 
Charles Bratcher Family; 
in memory of Mrs.  Ora 
Speegle, Mr. ft Mrs. John 
Blackwell & Family; in 
memorv of Robin-

Public Notice
A Budget hearing for 

3-Way Independent School 
District August  20, 1979, 8 
p.m. at the School Board 
Meeting Room. The pur ­
pose of the meeting is to 
adopt the School Budget 
for the 1979-80 school 
year.
15-311-1 tc

PYROTHERM
INSULATION

Guaranteed for life of 
strnctnre

FREE ESTIMATE

Marvin or George 
Nieman

272-5564 or 965-2488 
15-29s-tfc

ELECTRICAL WORK: Reason 
able rates, jobs large or small, 
Jerry Teaff Electric.
Ptiooe 933-4659, Bala
15 31t-tfc

ASPHALT ROOFING 
COMPOSITION 

SHINGLES
if and repair

Free Estimates.
Call Collect 
Ron Foahee 

385-5680
LITTLEFIELD ROOFING

CUSTOM HOME • 
ADD ON - 

REMODELING 
CALL

J ft R CONSTRUCTION 
272-3758 

OR
272-4347 

15-14t-tfc
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • a * *

own & Country Equities

FOR SALE: 4 bedroom, 2 
bath,  livingroom, den, 
cellar and patio. Financ­
ing available. Call
272-3496 or 272-3761 
8-30s-6tc

18. GARAGE SALES

GARAGE SALE: Thurs. ,  
Fri. ft sat. II miles north 
of Muleshoe on Hwy 214. 
First house north of Clays 
Corner.  JoAnn McGuire.
18-311-1 tc

HAVE TWO 
HAY WAGONS 

AND
BOB TAIL TRUCKS

Can haul 5 to 6,000 
bales of hay from your 
fields per day. Reason­
able. 1-505-356-4028 or 
1-505-359-0634.

I 

I

I
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I_ J 5  29t-16tp

Farm Custom Work
6-Row Equipment 

6 or 8 Row Wick Spraying

925-6743

son, Mr. & Mrs. John 
Blackwell ft Daughters;  in 
memory of Alvie Palmer,  
Mr. & Mrs. John Black- 
well & Daughters;  in 
memory of Mrs.  Frances 
Whit tenberg,  Mr. T.L. 
Glasscock; in memorv of 
Mr. Dick Chisholm, Mr. & 
Mrs. Bernis Camp; in 
memory of Johnnie 
Williams, Holly ft Ted 
Millsap and Thresia & 
Elmer Davis; in memory of 
Cynthia Harris King, Betty 
Hopper ft Family; in 
memory of S.A. (Jake) 
Lambert,  Norris & Beckye 
Conklin; Jerry and Sheryl 
Sullivan; and Mr. and 
Mrs. Raleigh Mason; in 
memory of Justin Dean 
Ethridge, Anne ft Bernis 
Camp,  Mr. & Mrs. Bill 
Taylor, Mrs.  Kathryn Cole 
Pat ft Inez Bobo, The S.M . 
Ethridges,  Buck & Maxine 
Ragsdale,  The Robert 
Hunt Family and Max ft 
Pat King.

Also in memory of T.J.  
Brantley, Donald, Bobbie 
& Greg Harrison and the 
Robert Hunt Family; in 
memory of Wanda Joyce 
Arnold, the Eugene Shaw 
Family; in memory of Buck 
Wood, Myron ft Mary 
Pool, Mrs. Arthur Crow 
and Buck & Maxine Rags- 
dale; in memory of W.R. 
Underdown, Buck & Max­
ine Ragsdale; in memory 
of Mrs. Joan E. Johnson,  
Dr. and Mrs.  Charles 
Lewis; in memory of J.D. 
Smith, Anne & Bernis 
Camp; in memory of Jared 
Michael Ethridge,  Max 
and Pat King; in memory 
of Craig James  Holt ,  the 
Robert Hunts;  in memory 
of Mrs. Joan E. Johnson,  
the John Neil Agee 
Family; in memory of 
Carolyn Lees, Charles 
Bratcher Family; in
memory of Everett Lamb­
ert, Muleshoe Local 
T.S.T.A. and Mr. ft Mrs. 
A.C. Bryant; in memory of 
Karen Mimms, Anne ft 
Bernis Camp, Thresia ft 
Elmer Davis, Mr. & Mrs. 
John Li Seaton and the 
Benny Pena Family; in 
memory of Mrs. Althea 
Hanks, Mr. & Mrs. Jim 
Young; in memory of MAs. 
Irene Watkins, Mr. & Mrs. 
Jim Yoling and the Doyce 
Turner Family; in memory 
of Mrs. Wessie Lee Herr ­

ington, Anne ft Bernis 
Camp; in memory of 
Walter Damron,  Mrs. 
Horace Blackburn; in 
memory of Billy Bell, Dr. 
Charles Lewis; in memory 
of Mrs.  Ruby Actkinson, 
Mr. ft Mrs Bernis Camp 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ken 
Angeley; in memory of 
Laura Jesko,  The Jerry 
Engelking Family and 
Brian Houston; in memory 
of Mrs.  Owetha Finley, 
Anne and Bernis Camo. 
and Mr. and Mrs. Vance 
Wagnon; in memory of 
Mrs. Carrie Shook, 
Mildred Davis, Anne ft 
Bernis Camp,  Mr. and 
Mrs.  O.D. Ray, Mrs. 
Elizabeth King and Mr. 
and Mrs.  T.R. White.

Left
energy
now.

Wanted:
Custom Silo Filling 

Have One Cutter — Three Trucks

Byron Myers 
Box 595

Tribune, Kansas 67879
i5-22t-23tP Ph. 316-376-4720

MIKE PEREZ
is the

New Owner o f  
George Cabreras

Janitorial Supplies
Mike will have a 
complete line of 
Janitorial Services 

&
Supplies.

"We wiII clean your 
place of business & your 
home" Also carpets cleaned

Save Time & Money, 
with the Professionals!

Mike Perez Janitor
S u p p l i e s  Ph.4332J9 1 1  W . 9th Ph.4244

Cover Your Tracks 
with a New 

Parish Rut-Filler
* - ; . 2 . z j J ?

~  -v -  j

V .9 ^
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From pumps to windmills, KMP has produced fine 
equipment for the farmer for many years. Now, KMP has 
designed and is manufacturing the Parish Rut-Filler which 
will level tracks behind sprinkler systems. With adjustable 
width and up and down swivel to match any terrain, the 
Parish Rut-Filler prevents plowing and harvesting 
equipment from having to cross over rough ground.

For more information, please contact;
American Valley, Inc.

MiilfNhoe, Texas

W. Hwv. 84 ph. 272-1266
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Navy Parachute Team To Perform At Reese Open House
Have you ever tried play­

ing ' ‘leapfrog”  12,500 feet 
above the ground? The 
skies above the Reese Air 
Force Base, Texas Open 
House will be filled with 
the U.S. Navy's Parachute 
West Demonstration Team 
"Leapf rogs” as they per ­
form a skyborne display of 
freefall parachuting.

The Reese Open House is 
scheduled for Saturday 
and Sunday, August  4 and 
5, 1979. The Leapfrogs will 
perform once each day. 
Their Saturday show is 
scheduled for 3 p.m. Their 
Sunday show for 1 p.m. 

The Leapfrogs are 
assigned to the U.S. 
Navy’s Special Warfare 
Group One based at the 
naval Amphibious Base 
Coronado, in San Diego, 
California.

All team members are 
selected from the Navy’s 
world famous underwater 
demolition “ frogman” 
teams((JDT)or  the Navy’s 
elite SEAL team. SEAL'S 
are the Navy's counter • 
guerrialla warfare experts 
who are trained to conduct 
small unit operations in 
hostile areas while opera t­
ing in and from the sea, 
air. and land.

During their Reese show, 
the Leapfrogs will perform 
the aerial acrobatics and 
precision free-fall para­
chute techniques used by 
members  of the UDT and 
SEAL teams during com­
bat airborne inflitration 
operations.

For the convenience of 
their viewing audience, 
the Leapfrogs attach 
colored smoke canisters to

their boots and d u m b  to an 
altitude of 12.500 feet (two 
mile) above the demon­
stration landing area. 
Their show emphasizes 
split-second aerial maneu­
vers and landing accuracy.

A jumper can control his 
freefall rate of descent 
from a relatively slow 
speed of 120 MPH to a 
breathtaking head down 
speed of 220 MPH by 
changing his body configu­
ration with his arms and 
legs. After free-falling for 
approximately 60 seconds, 
the Leapfrogs open their 
parachutes and three 
seconds, later their 
descent slows to a speed of 
approximately 5 MPH. By 
using their rectangular 
shaped parachute like a 
glider wing a junper can 
maneuver hemself at

speeds up to 35 MPH to a 
stand-up landing at a 
speed of 2 MPH in the 
center of the drop zone's 
target panel

Following each show, the 
Leapfrogs will be available 
to sign autographs and 
describe first-hand to their 
audience, the art of pa ra ­
chuting that is their 
profession.

Other highlights of Sa tur ­
day's Open House activi­
ties begin with a civilian 
aircraft fly-in from 9 a.m. 
to noon a chili cookoff will 
run from 10 a.m. to 6 p.m.- 
with an Ol' Fiddlers'  con­
test scheduled from 2 to 4 
p.m. The day winds up 
with a barbeque dinner 
from 6 to 9 p.m. and a 
street dance from 9 p.m.to 
m idnight.

Highlights on Sunday will 
be performances by the 
U.S. Air Force Drill Team 
from Washington,  D.C., 
the 539th U.S. Air Force

Band from Lackland AFB, 
Texas and at 3 p.m. the 
U.S. Air Force Thurder- 
birds Aerial Demonst ra ­
tion t e a m .

mw-
• Clarified Want Ad 

Are Fast Acting 
Because Most 
Everybody 
Uses Them.

Muleshoe & 
Bailey County | | 

Journal

272-4536

The
Sandhills

Philosopher
Editor 's note: The Sand­

hills Philosopher on his 
Johnson Grass farm on 
Sandv Creek tackles the 
confidence problem this 
week, sort of.
Dear editor:

As though the energy 
shortage wasn' t  enough of 
a problem, we now have a 
shortage of confidence, 
we've been told.

W e ’ve declared war on 
energy but to declare it on 
confidence too and try to 
fight two wars at the same 
time may be more than the 
government can handle. 
W indfall tax money will go 
just  so far.

Therefore it looks like 
we'll have to tackle the

confidence problem on our 
own without tax support.  
Right off I can tell you one 
cause of it.

It's the filing system used 
by the television industry.

For example,  an expert  
economist looks into the 
camera and tells us we're 
in a recession. Then some 
smart-alec in the TV studio 
digs back in the files and 
runs a shot of the same 
guy three months ago 
tellinp ns we a ren' t  going 
to have a recession.
O r a  politician appears on 

the screen saying we've 
got to have gas rationing. 
Followed by a film of him a 
few months ago saying 
under no circumstances 
will he support gas rat ion­
ing.

This may be amusing but 
it sure plays havoc with 
confidence.

If Congress wants to belp 
restore confidence f l k h i s  
country, not to iq^Kion

confidence in Congress,  it 
ought to pass a law 
prohibiting television s ta t­
ions from re-showing a 
news film or any part of it 
any sooner than five years 
after it's first shown.

How are we going to 
maintain confidence in our 
leaders when they're 
shown saying one thing 
todav and another next 
month? Such confusion 
has got to be stopped. 
Don't  the TV people know 
that sometimes confidence 
is based mainly on forget­
fulness?

And another thing, why 
hasn’t Washington
required the installation of 
thermostats  in air-condi­
tioned automobiles so they 
can be turned up too?

Yours faithfully, 
JA.

Jackson warns Soviets en­
circling oil countries.

0SDA
FOOD STAMPctmoi«
COME r< 
CASHWAY 
fOK YOU* 

WK CARD 
PURCHASES

Double Gunn Bros. 
Stamps 
Every 

Wednesday
^ C A S H W A Y

WeR eserve The Right To Limit Quantities

7:30 a.m. til 9:00 p.m.
MONDAY-SATURDAY

402 Main m m j fa l
272-4244 tB S S I

Armour Star AH Meat or AH Beef

Franks
12 Oz. Pkg. $ ] 0 9

Lb.

Swift's Premium Proton Beef

Round Steak

$2.29  ik.Boneless Round

Swift's Premium Proten Beef

Round Steak

Bone in Full Cut $2°9 u

Swift's Premium Proten Beef

Rump Roast ^

Boneless

Swift's Premium Proten Beef

Pikes Peak Roast

Boneless

Swift's Premium Proten Beef

Sirloin Tip Roast

s r „Boneless

California Tree Ripe Yellow Meat

Peaches
j

Dollie The “Dollar Stretcher ” says 
“Cashway has the highest Quality Meat 

in town and some of the lowest meat
Prices , check and see for Yourself. ”

White Swan

Mixed Vegetables...nwjmcw....3 /„ .l
White Swan Instant

Mashed Potatoes isoz,Bg«...... 6 5 c
White Swan

Table Salt...... 26 Oz. Rpwd Box 2 5
White Swan _ _

Tomatoes no. 303 ca n .................... 3 /  !
White Swan Pure ^

Instant Tea  30z. Jar..............................|

White Swan Luncheon

Napkins...........m ari*............. ”
Cleanser

Pine-Sol M0z:Bott*e * ] 59

White Swan whole

Green Beans ......

Reynold's Wrap h. roi 2 /$l

Texas Garden Fresh Yellow

Squash 29 Lb.

Golden Ripe

BANANAS

4„/*l
California Garden Fresh

Carrots............ ..............
Californio Early Grande

Nectarines........................

Gann-Ho
"SPECIAL"

2 5 *  

3 9 *  „

Free-Free-Free 
100 Gunn Bros. Stomps

and This Coupon 

No Purchase Necessary

*  FREE -FREE-FREE *
100 Gun Bro. Stamps

W it h  A  $ 1 0 . 0 0  P u r c h a s e  

O r  M o r e  

And This Coupon

Stilwells Chopped

Mustard Greens.

Sun-Vale Sliced

Strawberries 100z. Pkg. 3 9 '

Flav-R-Pac Frozen

Lemonade 6 Oz. Can 5 /9 9 *

. F r h i ^ ,

B a n q u e t

^ 4 J .  V. Dinners noz.Pkg. 5 9 '
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TFU Says USDA Plan Is Price Ceiling

ENJOYING THE I I D E - U s t  week, weather affected 
the crewde at a carnival la Maleahee, with high wind, 
■and and rain driving the people (real the midway, bnt 
they more than made ap (or the weather Saterday 
night, and handred* visited the caralval.

A.F. W alker 
Funeral Rites 
Held Tuesday

Funeral services for Andy 
Floyd Walker,  81, were 
conducted at 2:30 p.m. 
Tuesday in the Chapel of 
the Chimes with Rev. 
David Hamlin,  pastor of 
the First United Methodist  
Church of Muleshoe, 
officiating. Burial was in 
Bailey County Memorial 
Park under direction of 
Singleton-Ellis Funeral 
Home.

A resident  of Bailey 
County since 1966, he died 
at 10:35 a.m. Sunday at 
Methodist  Hospital in 
Lubbock. He was a retired 
farmer and a member of 
the Church of Christ in 
Sudan. Andy Floyd Walker 
was born May 30, 1892 in 
Covington, Tex. and 
moved to Knox City in 
1907 from Covington. He 
moved to Sudan from 
Knox City in 1941. He was 
married to Flossie Dutton 
on February S, 1966 at 
Clovis.

Survivors include his 
wife, Flossie; one son, 
Doyle Walker,  Van Horn; 
two daughters,  Geneva 
Thomasson and Jeri  
Herzog, both of Sudan; 
two stepsons,  Olen Dutton 
.Belton and Melvyn
Dutton, Petersburg;  two 
grandcildren; five
step-grandchildren and 10 
step-great-grandchildren.

A. F. WALKER

Gary Hart, S en ato r 
(D-Col):
“ I t ’s an ab so lu te  

anom aly  th a t you can 
operate a nuclear reactor 
in this country without an 
em ergency p lan .”

Senate approves health 
warning on liquor bottles.

USDA'S August 1st 
announcement  that there 
will be no set-aside on 
1980-crop wheat and 
concurrent  boast of
increased export grain
sales to the USSR is in 
essence “ a direct
economic policy to impose 
a price ceiling,”  says the 
Texas Farmers Union.

According to the farm 
group,  the combined 
actions of encouraging 
excessive production of 
wheat  by announcing no 
planting restrictions, the 
resulting lower target  
price support required by 
law, and the
announcement  that Russia 
would be allowed to 
purchase a maximum of 10 
million metric tons of 
wheat  in the 1980
marketing year will
together result________ in

maintaining price
suppressing surpluses on 
domestic markets.
A fter strong lobby efforts 
by farmers the past two 
years,  Congress several 
months ago amended the 
1977 Farm Act to allow for 
a higher wheat  target  price 
at the discretion of the 
Secretary whenever a 
set-aside requirement  is in 
effect. Consequently,  the 
1979 target  price was 
raised to S3.40. Due to no 
set-aside in 1980,
however,  the target will 
fall at least 20 cents a 
bushel  and possibly be 
lowered by as much as 45 
cents a bushel.  The final 
target  price for 1980 will 
not be announced until 
March 15, 1980, and must 
be in the range of S2.95 to 
$3.20 a bushel.

Beyond the lower

support,  the most serious 
price suppressing policy, 
according to TFU, is the 
restriction on the amount 
of wheat  to be exported to 
the USSR.

Under  a five-year agree­
ment with Russia, the U.S. 
agreed to supply a
minimum of 8 million 
metric tons of grain each 
year. Any sale of grain 
above that amount  is 
prohibited unless specific­
ally ordered by USDA.

USDA Economist Howard 
Hjort has stated publically 
that the shortfall in grain 
production in the Eastern 
Hemisphere could mean 
Russia may want to buy as 
much as 20 million tons of 
grain in 1980, the fourth 
year of the agreement .  But 
the announced limit of 10 
million tons of wheat  sales 
casts doubt as to whether

that predicted total will be 
realized in aggregate sales 
of other grains.

Simplifying the entire 
situation from the Te ia s  
Farmers Union
perspective,  state presid­
ent  Jay Naman called the 
U.S. -  U.S.S.R. trade 
agreement  “ nothing more 
than a complex set of rules 
that amounts to a game of 
trade restricitions” .

“ With grain prices now 
s tronger,”  he continued, 
“ the Administration is 
lifting planting restrictions 
and creating optomistic 
press reports of increased 
foreign sales. They are 
suckering farmers into 

more fence-row-to-fence- 
row planting to create 
another .domestic grain 
surplus and then plugging 
up international trade 
channels to keep the prices

cheap at home.
“ It doesn ' t  mat ter  how 

good foreign demand is 
when a Secretary of 
Agriculture has the
arbitrary power of trade 
restrictions. Our trade 
negotiators decry all forms 
of trade restrictions and 
barriers in OTHER
countries. But as soon as 
domestic commodity
prices begin to rise, as 
they have with wheat,  
those same ‘free t rade’ 
advocates suddenly
become market  manipul- 
tors to restrict export  and 
create domestic surpluses 
through one economic trick 
or another.

There should be vivid 
memories among wheat 
farmers of early seventies 
reign of Earl Butz when 
grain prices strengthened 
and they were to to go for

all-out production since 
the government  promised 
to sell it abroad.  Then 
came an embargo;  then 
came bumper crops; then 
came years of bankrupt  
grain prices that we are 
just now working out of.

Weve seen the ‘Boom 
and Bust ’ script too many 
t imes now in agriculture 
and have memorized it by 
heart .  The combination of 
no set-aside,  low supports 
and trade restrictions 
always ends sadly with 
cheap farm prices and 
additional thousands '  of 
farmers going out of 
bus iness ,”  Naman
concluded.

James Weaver, Chair­
man, House inquiry 
into Three Mile Island 
nuclear accident:
“ The same type mis­

hap is likely at any time at 
another nuclear power 
plant.”

FDouble Gunn Bros.

Stamps

Every  

Wednesday
CASHWAY

ff eReserve  The Right  To Limit Quantities

HORMELS SUPER SELECT 

FAMILY PACK

HORMELS SUPER SELECT

PORK STEAK

$1.39 u,

Dollie The “Dollar Stretcher ” says 
“Cashway has the highest Quality Meat 
Prices , check and see for Yourself." 

in town and some of the lowest meat

HORMELS SUPER SELECT

PORK CtlOPS
CENTER CUTS

$1.49 Lb.

BLACK LABEL

HORMELS BLACK LABEL 
THIN SLICED

r m e l  B a c o n
$ 4 3 4

LB. PKG.

DETERGENTSUPER SUDS.....ĝ nt.s|ZE Box...... 99c
DEODRANT SOAP,

SAFEGUARD......
THE BIG COOL 20 COUNT

STY NO CUPS 16 oz PKG; j

BEST MAID

BAR-B-Q-SAUCE 16 oz. BOTTLE i
BEST MAID

apple butter 28 oz.JAR

WHITE SWAN WITH SNAPS

BLACKEYE PEAS *300 CAN 3 /

WHITE SWAN

PEAR HALVES *303 CAN

b u sh ms best

HOMINY *300 CAN

OLD EL PASO

MENUD0 15 oz. CAN j

PARKAY SOFT

MARGARINE 1 LB. CTN.

RUFFLES

POTATO CHIPS REG. PRICE 99$ '

JENO'S

PIZZAS.. l2”-fKG-.. 98$
PET-RITZ

PIE SHELLS i  PKG 9 ? ...59$
CARNATION 2 lb. PKG.

HASHIR0WN POTATOES 79$
BANQUET

APPLE PIES °z PK 69$

7:30 am . til 9:00 p.m. 
monday-saturday

402 Main
2 ‘ 2 -4244 -  1323*

HORMELS SUPER SELECT

Pork Roast
* ] .2 9  „

PEYTONS RANCH BRAND

FRANKS
12 oz. PKG.

89$ u.

PEYTONS RANCH BRAND

I0L06NA
12 oz. PKG.

89$ la

WHITE SWAN

MACARONI & 
CHEESE DINNERS

r PALMOLIVE LIQUID

r N11r

CALIFORNIA THOMPSON SWEET WHITE SEEDLESS

GRAPES “ 49*
CALIFORNIA GREEN PASCAL

CILERY 2 7 *
TEXAS GARDEN FRESH GREEN HEADS

CABBAGE.... 9*
CALIFORNIA SANTA ROSA -  .

PLUMS................... “  .3/ 99*
TEXAS, VINE RIPE SWEET

CANTALOUPE M t s t a t a s s M w

C O M E  TO 
CASH WAY 
FOR YOUR 
WICCARD 

PURCHASES


