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Weather
June 29 98 64
June 28 99 63
June 27 96 62
June 26 85 59 C.
June 25 83 57
June 24 85 59 0.30
June 23 85 59 0.02
Precipitation to date 7.66
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July 4th Activities For Everyone
City Council Seeks 
New Municipal Judge

The city of Muleshoe is again 
without a city judge and city 
council members and Mayor 
Kenneth Henry are asking for 
applicants for the part-time job. 
Mayor Henry has asked that all 
interested persons contact City 
Manager Dave Marr prior to the 
next meeting of the council, 
scheduled at 8:30 a.m. on 
Thursday, July 7.

Marr reported to council mem­
bers that two applications have

around

Muleshoe
Funeral services were pending 

Wednesday morning at Single- 
ton-Ellis Funeral Home in Mule­
shoe for Dallas Kinard. 46, local 
businessman and horseman.

Kinard died Tuesday afternoon 
in Methodist Hospital in Lub­
bock where he had undergone 
surgery several days ago. 

*****
George Mitchell of Muleshoe is 

attending a five-week summer 
camp at Fort Riley. Kan., for 
advanced students in the 
Reserve Officers Training 
Corps.
Mitchell is one of 12 ROTC 

cadets from Northwestern Okla­
homa State University at the 
camp this year.

Participation in the summer 
camp is required of the cadets 
between their junior and senior 
years in the ROTC program. 

*****
Anton’s Summer Baseball pro­

gram is sponsoring a men's slow 
pitch softball tournament July 
11-17 to aid the summer pro­
gram.

Entry fee is $35 per team, plus 
one softball.

Entries may be sent to Dewey 
Peacock by July 5 at P.O. Box 
801, Anton, Texas 79313 or 
phone 997-4321.

* * * * *
Registration for the second 

summer term at South Plains 
College will be from 1:30 to 4 
p.m. on Tuesday, July 5, in the 
SPC Administration building. 
Late registration will continue 

during office hours each day 
through July 11, according to 
Jerry Barton, registrar and dean 
of admissions.

• *  *  *  •

Hazel Cunningham flew to 
Dallas Sunday to be with her 
sister. Juanita Wynn, during 
by-pass surgery Monday in a 
Dallas hospital.

*****
Visitors in the Buck Creamer 

home this weekend will be their 
daughter and family. Mr. and 
Mrs. Weldon McBride. Rhonda 
and Ronnie, from Plano.

Mrs. McBride and Rhonda 
expect to spend several days 
visiting the Creamers, their 
brother Forest Creamer and 
sister, Cleta Williams.

*****
In the Sunday. June 26 paper, 

the name of Floyd Tallent was 
incorrectly spelled, he was also 
cont. on page 3 col. I

been made for the position of 
municipal judge, but additional 
applications will be accepted 
until Thursday.

Former City Judge James Wil­
liams resigned recently to be­
come a deputy sheriff for the 
Bailey County Sheriff's office. 
Interim municipal judge is Jus­
tice of the Peace Ken Martin. 

During the Tuesday morning 
meeting of the city council, the 
city manager reported that 
everything is on schedule for the 
proposed paving project, ex­
pected to get underway later in 
the summer.
Council members urged that 

anyone not presently included in 
the proposed project and wish­
ing to have their street paved, 
to contact a member of the city 
council, the mayor or the city 
manager. The streets must be 
designated prior to the final 
public hearing on the project. 
They viewed architectural 

drawings of the proposed pro­
ject, which includes streets in 
the Country Club Addition; the 
Harvey Addition; East Sixth 
Street; a portion of West Ave­
nue I and West Avenue H.
Once the final reading of the 

ordinance authorizing the pav­
ing program is read, it will be 
too late for interested persons to 
join the project, they explained.

Marr explained that the paving 
is expected to be completed 
prior to the first freeze date in 
mid-October.
Also during the meeting, coun­

cil members discussed the up­
coming Bailey County Civic 
Center which will be getting 
underway in the near future. 
They are attempting to obtain 
permission to use previously

cont. on page 3 col. 2

Harmon Named 
Texas League 
1977 Director

Don W. Harmon, president of
Tri-County Savings and Loan 
Association, has been named a 
director of the Texas Savings 
and Loan League. Harmon was 
elected while attending the Lea­
gue's annual convention 
recently in El Paso.
The League represents more 

than 315 insured savings and 
loan associations in Texas with 
combined total assets in excess 
of $20 billion.

Harmon has served as presi­
dent and managing officer of 
Tri-County Savings since the 
association was chartered in 
1964. In that time, it has grown 
to $20 million in assets and has 
branch offices in Littlefield, 
Friona and Farwell.
A native of Muleshoe, Harmon 

received a degree in business 
front.Tcxas Tech University and 
began his career with First 
Federal Savings and Loan in 
Lubbock.

He served two terms as presi­
dent of the Muleshoe Chamber 
of Commerce and Agriculture 
and is currently serving on the 
cont. on page 3 col, I

NEW PARK PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT INSTALLED...City 
workmen were busy this week installing new playground equipment 
which was purchased for the new city park on West Avenue D by the 
Young Homemakers Organization. The Young Homemakers

purchased heavy swings and other equipment. Shown putting
chains on the swing poles are from left on ladder. Danny Atwood 
and Robert Reynero. On the ground preparing the chain for 
installation are from left, Martin Lopez and Bill Wilkins.

Annual Sidewalk Sale 
Offers Many Bargains
Discriminating shoppers will 

converge on Muleshoe Saturday 
morning for the annual, 
ever-popular sidewalk sale. 
Many local merchants will join

Police Report

FIRST DOLLAR OF PROFIT ..Ixc Dunbar, who opened Lee’s 
Western Wear on West Arocrnan Blvd. Monday, receives his first 
'Dollar of Profit' from Howard Watson, president of the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce and Agriculture.

Herb Ramage reported to 
Bailey County Law Enforcement 
Officers that a pickup had been 
stolen Sunday night. Monday 
afternoon, the pickup was recov­
ered cast of Muleshoe.

No arrests were made in the 
theft, and it is still under 
investigation by the Bailey 
County sheriff s office.

Also reported stolen during the 
past several days were six 
steers, reported by Vernon 
Bryant; a boy's 10-speed 
bicycle, reported by Creston 
Faver and an air compressor, 
reported by S.P. Stockard.
Arrests included three drunk; 

two for possession of marijuana 
and one each for no driver's 
license; mental patient; assault 
and disturbance; disturbance 
and two illegal aliens.

Local Youth 
Attend Teen 
Leader Lab

Several Bailey County resi­
dents were among nearly 200 
young leaders from 4-H clubs in 
20 south plains counties partici­
pating in a district team leader 
lab June 15-17.

Included were Johnny Puckett, 
Kelly Harrison, Jimmy Gleason, 
Belinda Wheeler. Delia Shaw, 
Kristi Henry and Jacinda Glea­
son.
A team of 12 older youths from 

Lubbock. Crosby, Lynn. Daw­
son. Garza and Cochran Coun­
ties conducted the learning ex­
periences for the 4-H'ers at­
tending the lab.
The youths performed a variety 

of tasks ranging from group 
learning and discussions to 
game tournaments and special 
morning and evening ceremon­
ies. F.mphasis was on success of 
the local 4-H club.

Activities were geared toward 
teaching officer duties in the 
local 4-H club, electing club 
officers, conducting a mock club 
meeting, and planning the 4-H 
club program for a year. Time 
for relaxation and fun provided 
the teens with the opportunity to 
make new friends
The annual leader lab helps 

4-H youth to develop skills 
in working with younger club 
members and provides an op 
port unity for them to broaden 
their friendships and develop 
leadership qualities

in the fun and festivities anh 
move tables and much merchan­
dise onto the sidewalks for the 
all-day sale.

Some of the stores participat­
ing in the sale will be Gibson's, 
who will be offering one-fourth

3-2 Pitch 
Softball 
Carnes Set
One of the highlights of the 

July 4th celebration in Mule- 
shoe will be a men's 3-2 
slowpitch softball tournament 
planned in conjunction with the 
full day of activities and celebra­
tion.

Kerry Moore, spokesman for 
the Muleshoe Softball League, 
said the tournament will be 
getting underway at 10 a.m. and 
will feature from five to seven 
teams at the men's softball 
diamond just south of the radio 
station on West Eighth Street.

He said no admission charge 
will be made and concession 
stands will be available through­
out the day. Tl c tournament is - 
expected to end shortly after 3 
p.m.. in time for players to 
attend the parade.

Approximately 26-27 minutes 
will be needed to play each 
game and trophies will be 
presented each member of the 
winning team.

Moore explained that in a 3-2 
tournament, each batter steps 
up with a full count, and he has 
one chance to cither hit. walk or 
be struck out.

Class Of *67 
Plans Reunion 
Sunday Night

Members of the 1967 graduat­
ing class of Muleshoe High 
School will have a tenth year 
reunion Sunday,July 3, 7 to 9 
p.m. in the old city park in 
Muleshoe.
Highlight will be a "Show and 

Tell” presentation, and all class 
members attending are asked to 
bring their family and photo­
graphs for showing their former 
classmates.

Some former class members 
have not been located as yet, so 
members are asked to contact 
Jerry Redwine. Drawer L. Mule- 
shoe or Mrs. Jay Campbell, the 
former Ann Phelps, at Box 1204. 
Gainsvillc, if you know where 
some members can be located. 
Or coptaet all former 1967 
classmates you know of and give 
them a special invitation to 
attend the 10th year reunion of 
the class! of '67.

off on all ice cream freezers and 
Cokes for 10 cents and hot dogs 
for 25 cents, along with many 
other items of merchandise.

Bursinger will be continuing 
their gigantic sale on all infant 
through teen fashions. Perry's 
will offer aluminum lawn chairs 
for 2/$7 and will have polyester 
double knit for 88 cents a yard.
At St. Clair's you will be able 

to find many items with the 
clearance sale which will offer 
styles for men. women and 
children, including sportswear, 
shoes and accessories.
The Fair Store will have ladies' 

short sets and dresses for $2.98 
each and will have boy's shirts 
for only $2.50.

Main Street Beauty Salon will 
have much merchandise to offer 
the women, including turquoise 
jewelry for half price and rain 
coats and capes for $1.35.

At Cobh's, you will find men's

swim suits for $1 and $2. along 
with ladies shoes for $l-$4, 
along with a multitude of other 
bargains.

Cashway will be giving away 
free Cokes and ice cream to all 
their shoppers and Anthony's 
will have a large display of 
merchandise during the day.

Annually, the sidewalk sale 
draws hundreds of shoppers to 
Muleshoe, who will be search­
ing the bargain tables in the sale 
which heralds the approach of 
the July 4th celebration.

To add to the spirit of the day, 
many merchants and their em­
ployees will be dressed in 
pioneer fashion, with prizes

slated for the merchant with the 
most participation and to the 
most appropriately dressed 
merchant or employee.

Fireworks Causing 
Serious Injuries
Last summer in Texas nine 

youngsters were blinded by 
carelessness with fireworks, re­
ported from a survey conducted 
by the Texas Society for the 
Prevention of Blindness. 
Eighty-nine responding oph-

Tennis Tourney 
Finals Slated 
On July 4th

Finals in the four-day Mule- 
shoe Jayccc tennis tournament 
will begin at II a.m. on Mon­
day. July 4th at the high school 
tennis courts.
All first and second round 

games will be played after 5 
p.m. on Friday, Saturday and 
Sunday. July 1-3, prior to the 
finals on the fourth.

Any conflict in the schedule as 
to the time of play will need to 
be worked out between 
scheduled teams. All consola­
tion games will be arranged by 
the players and played on the 
high school tennis courts.
Kent Kelley, chairman of the 

Jaycee project said brackets will 
be posted on the window at 
Muleshoe Motor Company and 
at the tennis court.
Cokes and concession stands 

will be available at the courts 
during the entire tournament, 
Kelly added.
All interested persons may

attend the tournament without
charge. Prizes will be awarded 
in first and second places and in 
the consolation bracket.

thalmologists also treated 34 
persons for eye injuries, with 
bottle rockets causing the great­
est number of eye loss and 
damage cases.

Fireworks, even the small 
ones, arc still a needless men­
ace to Americans. Even spark­
lers. usually purchased for small 
children, burn at 1,650 degrees 
Fahrenheit, leaving a steel core 
hot enough to sear flesh or set 
clothing afire. A five year old 
San Antonio girl was treated for 
severe eye damage from just 
that cause in 1976, the Society 
reported.

Ironically, the greatest number 
of accidents were reported in 
the major cities of Texas, where 
it is illegal to have fireworks 
within the city limits.
The Federal Consumer Pro­

ducts Safety Commission stated 
fireworks caused approximately 
4.750 hospital recorded injuries 
last year; more than half the 
victims were under 15 years. 
The Commission is presently 
working on a control law which 
will ban all but the smallest 
fireworks in Texas.
The Texas Society makes a 

special appeal to parents to sec 
•o it that children are not 
permitted the use of any form of 
fireworks, and to see that their 
children arc kept away front 
anyone who is using them. 
Remember that fireworks are 
not toys for children.
C elebrale the 4th of July, bv all 

means, but without fireworks. 
Attend a public display, sit at a 
distance and enjoy the thrill of 
»ur nation's 201st birthday cclc
bralion.

Full Day Is Planned 
For Annual Festival
It’s bigger and better than 

ever! If you don't like what's 
going on in Muleshoe July 4th, 
wait a few minutes and some­
thing different will be taking 
place. There’s something for 
everyone, of all ages, through­
out an action-packed day which 
will get underway with the 
annual Pony Express Race from 
Necdmore to Muleshoe at 7:30 
a.m.
An annual affair, the Pony 

Express Race will pit some of 
the top riders of the area, 
switching horses every one-half 
mile down both sides of the 
ditches in an attempt to get the 
mail to town. In the mail pouch 
will be a proclamation about the 
celebration.
This will be followed by the 

County Fair, which will start 
around 8:30-9:00 a.m. on the 
courthouse lawn. What will it 
feature? For starters, booths 
with homemade ice cream; soft 
drinks; tumbling acts; dunking 
board; hobby and crafts display; 
art show ; quilt give-away; draw­
ing for one-half beef; skeet 
shoot; foods of all types; pas­
tries and a baking contest for 
men.

Cheerleaders 
Busy Selling 
Subscriptions

If a smiling young lady con­
tacts you and identifies herself 
as Jan Simpson, Cheryl Waltrip. 
Christy Feagley, Mitzi Robert­
son or Kenna Warren, all cheer­
leaders at Three Way High 
School, they are on a money 
making project. Also contacting 
you may be Susan Dupler or 
Mary Jo Dupler, twirlers for the 
school.
The group is presently selling 

subscriptions to the Muleshoe 
Journal and Bailey County Jour­
nal. They will receive a percent­
age of the subscription collected 
to help pay expenses for the 
1977-78 school year.
However, one word of caution! 

Deadline for subscribing 
through the Three Way cheer­
leaders and twirlers is July 15. If 
you have your subscription or­
der in by that time, you will 
have one year of all the county­
wide and area news not once, 
but twice, each week.

Included will be news from 
Muleshoe. Necdmore, Enochs, 
Bula and the Three Way! com­
munities. including school acti­
vities from Three Way and 
Muleshoe and local comings and 
goings of residents, as well as 
up-to-date crop information.
Help your cheerleaders help 

you by subscribing to the 
Journals for information twice a 
week on what's going on in your 
county.

Also at the same time, the 
annual muleshoe pitching con­
test will get underway with 
Russell Magby defending the 
title he wrested from longtime 
winner. Ed Ncutzler. last July 
4th.

Several divisions will be held 
and registration will end at 10 
a.m. for the popular contest.

While all of this is going on, 
the kids activities w ill be getting 
underway on the west court­
house parking lot and west 
Second Street. Beta Sigma Phi 
w ill be sponsoring the Kid's Day 
activities for youngsters age one 
through 12.
Starting off with a bike race at 

10 a.m. will be a shoe race for 
the tots and toddlers up to the 
12 year olds at another location 
at the same time. At 10:30 a.m. 
w ill be the tire race and crawling 
race, followed by the tricycle 
race and sack race at II a.m. 
Hot wheels will be at 11:30 a.m. 
and the egg race at 12 noon. At 
12:30 will be the balloon break 
and at 12:45 the orange peel.
All day kid's activities will be 

bobbing for apples, buried trea­
sure. fishing, limbo and darts. 

Replacing the annual Jaycee 
Ride-In. Fly-In Breakfast will be 
a Jaycee-sponsored donut, 
coffee and juice booth. The 
Jaycees will also be conducting 
the ounking board, with a 
number of dignitaries expected 
to be taking to the board 
throughout the day.

Starting at 11 a.m. will be the 
finals of the Jaycee Tennis 
Tournament at the high school 
tennis courts and at 10 a.m. the 
3-2 slowpitch men’s softball 
tournament will get underway. 
At 2 p.m. will be the Old 

cont. on page 3 col. 1

Plans Complete 
For Lazbuddie 
July Crusade

The Lazbuddie 'Meet Jesus' 
Crusade will be at the Lazbud­
die school football stadium be­
ginning Sunday evening, July 
17. and continuing each evening 
through July 24 at 8:30 p.m. 
each evening.

Evangelist will be Rev. Paul H. 
Coxe of Midland. He has been 
preaching for 41 years in both 
pastoral and evangelistic minis­
try and is now pastor of one of 
the fastest growing churches in 
Midland.
Presenting special music 

throughout the week will be 
Roger McDuff, internationally 
known soloist, who is a regular 
guest on the P.T.L. television 
show.

Ronald Elliott of Lazbuddie is 
chairman; Gary Hicks, prayer 
chairman; David Nelson, ar-

cont. on page 3 col. I

ROY Al III IRS TO PERFORM I'hc Rov.tlhcirs, from Amarillo, will 
In- performing during the evening. Monday. July 4. at the Avenue D 
Cits park. Ihcir program will be at 8 p m and will feature gospel 
music.

I  •
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Festival...
coni, from page 1 
Settler's Reunion at the fellow­
ship hall at the First United 
Methodist Church. Entertain­
ment during the afternoon will 
be by the "King's Kids" a local 
gospel quarlet.

R.A. Bradley and the Mule- 
shoe Kiwanis will head up the 
parade at 4 p.m. It will get 
underway at the Boy Scout Hut, 
travel north down main to 
Highway 84, one block west on 
84 and turn south on West First 
Street. The parade will end at 
the Boy Scout Hut.

Featured will be floats, riding 
clubs, bands, antique cars and 
individual riders.

Local groups will be perform­
ing at the West Avenue D City 
Park prior to the fireworks 
Monday night. Following the 
family picnic at the park, enter­
tainment will be by Billy Don­
aldson and Patty Pena; R.A. 
Bradley and his quartet; and at 
8 p.m. will be the Royalheirs 
from Amarillo.

Muleshoe...
cont. from page I

survived by his wife, Thelma, 
and two sons, Leslie, of the 
home, and James of Oklahoma 
City, Okla., and three 
daughters. Carolyn Stancell of 
Muleshoe, Kathy and Brenda, 
both of Oklahoma City, Okla. He 
had three sisters, Mrs. Beaulah 
Gatewood of Muleshoe, Mrs. 
Pauline Binion and Mrs. Ruby 
Aaron, both of McKinney, and 
one brother, Troy of Sherman.

HarmoB...
cont. from page 1

West Texas Chamber of Com­
merce board and the South 
Plains Mortgage Bankers. He is 
also a member of the Texas 
Certified Public Accountants 
Association and serves on the 
Muleshoe Independent School 
Board.
Harmon is a member of the 

Muleshoe Church of Christ. He 
and his wife Wanda, are the 
parents of three children.

Crusade...
cont. from page 1 
rangements chairman; Eddie 
Matthews, finance chairman; 
Glenn Lust, publicity chairman; 
Claud Gregory Jr., usher chair­
man; Gary L. Wilcox, music 
chairman and counseling chair­
men are Bobby R. Smith and 
Kenneth Vincent.

A meeting of all committees is 
planned at 8 p.m. on Tuesday. 
July S, at the Lazbuddie First 
Baptist Church. Each church 
participating in the crusade is 
asked to be represented and 
nominate one or more persons 
for each committee.

The Rovalhcirs. although hav­
ing mastered a professional 
sound, and receiving favorable 
recognition from highly-regard­
ed music critics, the depth of 
sound is not totally music. The 
Amarillo group is expected to 
provide top gospel music in the 
evening preceding the 10 p.m. 
fireworks.
Capping off the full day of 

activities will be the annual 
Fireworks, sponsored by the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture, and 
displayed by the Muleshoe Vol­
unteer Fire Department.
On Friday, July I and Satur­

day, July 2, the annual Junior 
Rodeo will feature some top 
talent at the Muleshoe Roping 
Arena, perfotmances are at 8 
p.m. each evening.

Judge...
cont. from page I

approved bond money for fur­
nishings and equipment for the 
new building at the west city 
limits of Muleshoe.

Approved were two resolu­
tions, both seeking federal 
funds. One grant would be used 
to lower three city water wells 
and the other would be used 
with matching funds for parks 
improvement.. Included in the 
improvements would be irriga­
tion systems, a chain link fence, 
restrooms and resurfacing the 
city tennis courts.

Discussed, with no action tak­
en, was possible city participa­
tion in a summer youth program 
and the upcoming airport pro­
ject. A work session will be 
scheduled with the Airport 
Board and City Council to 
discuss the upcoming improve­
ment project.

NEWS VIEWS
Otis G. Pike. Congress­

man (D-NY), offering 
am endm ents to delete 
pay hike;
“ We told the average 

taxpayer it would be infla­
tionary to give him $50. 1 
am asking you to say you 
can do without $12,900.”
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Sheep, Goat Herds 
in State Continue 

Drop in Number
AUSTIN-The smallest 

wool and mohair clips since 
the first part of the century 
were reported last year, 
Agriculture Reagan V. 
Brown has announced.

‘‘Increased production 
costs and competition from 
synthetic fibers accounted 
for the continuing drop in 
herd numbers of both sheep 
and goats," Brown noted.

Texas Crop and Livestock 
Reporting Service figures 
show the value of mohair in 
1976 at near record levels, 
with an all-time high average 
price of $2.97 per pound 
received. Cash received 
totaled $24 million.

Fewer goats and kids were 
clipped last year than at any 
time since estimates began in 
1909, with the 1,100,000 
head shorn in 1976 also

down from 1975 by nine per 
cent. Overall output in the 
industry was also aided, 
however, by a record fleece 
weight of 7.4 pounds per 
animal, Brown explained, 
which was some .3 pound 
above the 1975 average.

Total value of the 1976 
clip, at $24.1 million, was up 
52 per cent from 1975 and 
near the record high values 
of $25.1 and $27.4 million 
of 1963 and 1964, 
respectively.

The 1976 wool clip, at 
20.1 million pounds, was the 
smallest since 1919 when 
production totaled 18.2 
mUlion pounds.

At the same time, value of 
the wool production for the 
year was up to $15.8 million 
from $14.8 million in 1975.

Life
At age 20 we don’t 

care what the world thinks 
of us; at age 50 we find 
out it wasn’t thinking of 
us at all.

-Courier, Reinbeck.
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Traffic Deaths Mar 
Holiday Celebrations
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The Fourth-of-July holiday 
period was the deadliest 3-day 
weekend of last year. Fifty-five 
traffic related deaths were re­
corded in Texas. Statistics also 
show Joly to be the heaviest 
traveled month of 1976.

Mindful of the long weekend 
and increased travel, Governor 
Dolph Briscoe asked Texans to 
rally to face the problem of
traffic accidents. Said Briscoe. 
"Texans pride themselves on 
their sense of individual respon­
sibility. If they are properly 
informed of a problem, it is my 
conviction they will respond 
positively and quickly. The fa­
tality rate on our streets and 
highways during the Fourth-of- 
July holiday must be considered 
a critical problem facing all

A verage
He's a very forthright 

character. H e’s rig h t 
about a fourth of the time.

-News. Danburg, Conn.

Texans. Any real solution de­
pends on each of us taking full 
responsibility for his own behav­
ior behind the wheel," said the 
Governor.

Briscoe’s Traffic Safety Repre 
sentative, Ken Nevil, said if 
motorists would not rush they 
would have a much better
chance of survival as they 
travel. "Interstate accidents 
have increased by 45 percent 
over last year. This is due to 
several factors including 
increased travel, disregard for 
speed limits, heavy alcohol use 
and the like. Frequently, drivers 
concentrate on their holiday fun 
rather than the heavy responsi­
bility of maneuvering an auto­
mobile. As drivers, we must 
anticipate the unexpected and 
be prepared to react. We must 
rely upon good judgement and 
skills. But. we must be compas­
sionate in our driving. The basic 
rules are: leave early enough for 
trips, limit the use of alcohol, 
maintain moderate speed and

H n n n  U l i F
1 1 : 0 0  pm S n n On ;

H
10 00IfUl MM44__

5 00 pm . Friday
Qtmt Mc+Ust

6 oo p *  S at.

VlMdft /

1

t : M  p m . F r W . y  1____________
J o n  C o l b u t

J M B  X a - J M T  l . t  *77

t o  o o  n »  S a t .
Ha a s Iu U I  S U p i t n  , OPEN9 .Z B  pm . F M d a ?  1

10:00 pm | r H . J
______ '

<u». . ■ ■ i d j n _______r
I
I

nuiESNOC JM C tts£
TENUIS TOOKfOlEflT 

I'.Ef'S SfWSlES

keep totally alert to potential 
traffic hazards. The traffic acci­
dent problem requires every­
one's help, collectively and in­
dividually. If we drive as a team, 
together we could reduce the 
death toll,”  concluded Nevil.

•  •  *  •
Too many specialists, 

not enough  b roadened  
p erso n a litie s , make for 
narrow viewpoints.

We Are Continuing Our 4th Of July 
Clearance - Sat. July 2

n e "u  <■u
* *  4 . ‘V *  c  S# ™

°V er.
Cauchos

up s °ord .in
,U*C*

% poivt
B lo u»- o r tn a h

Jeo n *

Enjoy Shopping In  The 
Cool Indoors

p o ) a  
Qtes
Suit*

A LL SALES 
FIN AL

BURSTER FASHIONS
PHONE 806 272-3459 1519 WEST AMERICAN BLVD.

MULESHOE, TEXAS 79347

1 U E R E ’ W U A M 0 R C  
B U L L  TflR O W IW ' ,  iHMJ emaooeaN xr 
THE R0DE0-WS7W!
Joseph A. Califano Jr., 

HF.W S ecre ta ry , on 
hospital costs ceiling: 
“ W e’re giving them 

ample room, we’re just 
asking them to cut the fat 
and waste out.”

There is no such thing as 
solitude, nor anything 
that can be said to be 
alone and by itself, 
save God.

-Thomas Browne.

ATTENTION 
MULESHOE AREA 

CATTLEMEN
... In regard to dead stock 
removal ... If you have a 
problem with service ... 
whether in the feed yard or on 
the farm ... Please give US a 
chance! Thank You.

YOUR LOCAL USED 
COW DEALER IN 

MULESHOE
Phone %S-2903 
Mobile 9h5-2<129

Muleshoe
Bi-Products

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

CNIMST KE M TNWN

All Travelers Drive carefully
M ORTQN

POT PIES......4 /$ l

SHURFRESH

SH  SAUSAGE................ 9 9 (
LEMONADE.................5 /$ l  ‘

HOT COOKED FOODS
•H4CIICIIEV . IN  MSS 
•NIUSKS OHIO LINKS
•NINOS .CORN NGS

•GEBMM SAUSAGE 
•BBU BARBECUE BEEF 
*nGBEEFSIBDISICHES

m i n u t e  m a id

LIMEADE....................5 /$ l
10 lb . BOX

TIDE
ROXEY

MNP TIM FMEMT. CMVEHEIT
lusurs sum had toui

.....................$3,991
m e  fo o d  ....... j 4 /  $ i « » * « « “ »,lu
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Miss Carolyn Stroud 
Wed To Michael Kirby

. i

MR. AND MRS. MICHAEL CRAIG KIRBY

M ia  % u k < i

H o io t U  M id
Honored with a bridal shower 

Saturday afternoon, June 25, 
was Miss Becky Diane Sain, 
bride-elect of Gary Waynne 
Smith. The shower was held in 
the home of Mrs. S. P. Stockard. 
The serving table was laid with 

a white cloth and centered with 
an arrangement of spring flow­
ers of yellow, orange and blue. 
Two white cakes were decorated 
with blue wedding bells. 
Banana punch was also served

to the guests from crystal ap­
pointments.

Miss Sain was presented a 
corsage of spring flowers.
The hostess gift was Faber- 

ware stainless steel.
Hostesses for the occasion 

were Mrs. Gerald Shanks. Mrs. 
Cleon Davis, Mrs. Barney 
Scheller, Mrs. Joe Farris, Mrs. 
Charles Bratcher, Mrs. Richard 
Warren, Mrs. W.L. Speck. Mrs. 
Les Mills, Mrs. Bob Dodd, Mrs.

Chester Yerby, Mrs. Lester 
Baker, Mrs. J.W. Barber, Mrs. 
Earl Peterson, Mrs. O.M. 
Lackey and Mrs. S.P. Stockard

&&&*
Bikinis, maillots, and 

straight bathing suits are in 
the smart shops. Stripes in a 
bias design seem to be 
popular. Bikinis are sold as 
separates, in order to get the 
proper fit.

Short or long dresses may 
be worn for evening cocktail 
parties. Accessories dress up 
the suit dress ensemble after

An afternoon ceremony in the 
Enochs Baptist Church united in 
marriage Miss Carolyn Sue 
Sliouil and Michael Craig Kirby 
Salurday, May 28. Rev. Charlie 
Shaw officiated at the 
double ring ceremony.
The bride is the daughter of 

Mi and Mrs. E.G. Stroud of 
Enochs. Mr. and Mrs. Reuel 
Kiiby of Three Way are the 
parents of the groom.
The couple repealed their vows 

in Iron! of an archway covered 
with red and white carnations 
and white candles. Red and 
while bows and streamers mark­
ed l lie pews.

Mrs. Jerry Nichols, organist, 
was accompanied by Mrs. Les­
ter Bounds, soloist, as they 
presented the traditional wed­
ding music.
Given in marriage by her 

father, the bride was attired in a 
while gown of dotted swiss 
styled in a princess style with 
full sleeves and elbow length 
cufls. The bodice and cuffs were 
enhanced with white lace. The 
bride's veil was train length of 
tulle bordered in wide lace. She 
carried a bouquet of red roses 
and baby's breath accented with 
while lace and red and white 
streamers.

Wesl Plains
Medical 

lenler Briefs
ADMISSIONS 
June 23: Clara B. Crain 
June 24: Lillie Sims 
June 25: Commie Blain, Alma 

Rosa Franco and Steven Davis. 
June 2b: Frances Bland, 

Juanita Lumbera, Chester Hors­
ley, Effie Splawn and Toni 
Gilley.
June 27: H.E. Reeder, Jr., 

Virgil Williams and Viviana 
Segovia.
DISMISSALS
June 23: Louise Faver and 

Arvel Robertson.
June 24: Clyde I. McMahan, 

Juanell Young, Pamela Kay 
Phillips and baby girl.
June 25: Tommy Sliger (trans­

ferred to Lubbock Methodist) 
June 27: Commie Blain, Steven 

Davis, Karl Dean Helker and 
Edith Bruns.

SAT. JULY 2

SPECIALS ON EARRINGS,
LADIES BELTS, SCARVES, SLIDES, 

CANDLEHOLDERS, CANDLES, NAPKIN 
RINGS I  MANY OTHER ITEMS TOO 

NUMEROUS TO MENTION.

Miss I I la Warren, Ihrcc Way, 
served the bride as maid of 
honor. Bridesmaid was Miss 
Juris Neut/lcr of Three Way. 
Miss Warren was attired in a 
red with white dotted swiss 
dress. The dress featured a 
fitted bodice in an empire style 
and narrow shoulder straps. She 
carried red carnations with 
white ribbons. Miss Ncutzler 
wore a white with red dotted 
swiss dress featuring a fitted 
bodice in an empire style and 
narrow shoulder straps. She 
also carried red carnations with 
while ribbons.
Serving as flowergirl was Miss 

Stacy Stroud of Mulcshoe, neice 
of the bride. She wore a floor 
length sundress. The dress was 
enhanced by a bodice of white 
with red. The skirt was of red 
with white dotted swiss.
Brian Kirby. Three Way, 

brother of the groom, served as 
best man. Groomsman was Bill 
Hod nett of Three Way. Serving 
as ushers were Janies Cook of 
Mulcshoe and Ronnie Richard­
son of Three Way. Ringbearer

was Christy Stroud, Dimmitt, 
neice ol the bride.
( amllclighlcrs were Steve Pol­

lard, Enochs, nephew of the 
bride, ami Stacy Kirby, Three 
Way, sister of the groom.
A reception was held in the 

Fellowship Hall of the Church 
following the ceremony. The 
sets ing table was laid with 
while lace over red. Red roses 
and while carnations accented 
with red and while ribbons was 
used as the centerpiece. The 
traditional white wedding cake 
trimmed with red roses was 
served to the guests.
For travel, the bride wore 

beige knit pants and a pullover 
blouse. The couple travelled to 
Ruidoso, N.M. They have made 
their home in Three Way.
The bride and groom are both 

graduates of Three Way High ’ 
School. He is presently engaged 
in farming.

A rehearsal supper was held at 
El Nuevo Leal's Restaurant in 
Mulcshoe. Hosts were the par­
ents ol the groom, Mr. and Mrs. 
Reuel Kirby.

MISS KAREN HEAD

LADIES SHOESeioeroriioirasizis
VALUES TO $28
PRICED fKOM

MEN’S JEAHS
SMALL GROUP BIG BELLS-BROREN SIZES

REG.PRICE15.50

S7.24 n
S I10 S4 MEHS SWIM SUITS

LADIES BRAS
SMALL GROUP OF

VALUES I0S 10
$1 io $2

IR0KEN SIZES

Vi PRICE
MEHS SUITS &
VALUES TO $120 SPORT COATS

VOICED FROM

$14.24 to $34.44GIRLS SLIPS
IR0KEN SIZIS-SHOP EARLY 

PRICED FROM

94* $1.24
MEHS WESTERN 
HATS & CAPS

PRICED FROM
50t T0 $2BOYS SHIRTS

| VALUES TO $12 
PRICED FROM

MENS TIES
VALUES TO $6.50 

PRICED FROM
$1 TO $1.50I SI .54 to $2.24

I BOYS SWIM SUITS
VALUES 10 *5.75 

PRICED FROM

84* to $1.94

MENS SHOES
FEW PAIR-RR0KEM SIZES

VMUCSTOS30  M icro  moM

$2 TO $4

H oward H. B aker Jr .. 
Senate R epublican 
leader:
“ It was a mistake to 

first offer the $50 rebates 
and then withdraw them 
and offer nothing in their 
place.”

•« i i ^  n  n > <

CATTLE PRICES CP BUT PRO­
DUCERS' SHARE LESS...Rull 
beef prices have increased a- 
bout 5 per cent in recent weeks, 
and cattlemen may soon be 
getting a slightly bigger piece of 
the beef profit pie, says a 
livestock marketing specialist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service. Of course, 
marketing costs have been part­
ially responsible for the Increase 
In retail beef prices, but these 
costs do not benefit producers. 
Following a substantial drop in 
the farm-to-retail price spread 
in April and early May, it is 
jumping up once again.

SIDEWALK

JULY WEDDING PLANNED...Mr. and Mrs. M.P. Bennett of 
Friona announce the engagement and approaching marriage of 
their daughter, Diane, to Ricky White, son of Mr. and Mrs. Carl 
White of Friona. The couple will exchange vow s Saturday, July 9, at 
7:00 p.m. in the First Baptist Church of Friona Miss Bennett and 
White arc both 1977 graduates of Friona High School.

M a i K o m k  M u U

J c t e d  M id  S h o w n
Miss Karen Head, bride-elect 

of Russell Trcider. was feted 
with a gift tea on Friday 
afternoon. June 24, in the home 
of Mrs. Reagan Cox.

The centerpiece of silk flowers 
carried out the bride’s colors of 
blue and white and w as set on a 
table laid with white lace over a 
blue cloth. Punch was served 
from an antique crystal punch 
bowl and thumbprint cookies 
were served from silver trays.

Special guests were Mrs. Nor­
man Head, mother of the 
honoree. Mrs. George Mitchell 
and Mrs. D.B. Head, grand­
mothers of the honoree, Mrs. 
Raymond Trcider. mother of the 
prospective groom and Mrs. 
Nola Trcider, grandmother of 
the prospective groom, of Laz-

Roman Gabriol Franco
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Franco 

of Muleshoe are the proud 
parents of a new baby boy born 
June 26. at 7:13 a.m. in West 
Plains Medical Center. The 
baby weighed seven pounds and 
six ounces and was named 
Roman Gabriel Franco. He is 
the couple's first child.

*****
Fashion designers are re­

sponding to energy conservation 
efforts by featuring fabrics and 
designs that are compatible with 
"warmer summer " and "cooler 
winter" controlled environ­
ments. says Mrs. Becky Culp, 
area clothing specialist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service. The Texas A&M Uni- 
versitv System.

buddie.
Other out-of-town guests were 

Mrs. Jim Mitchell. Las Vegas, 
N.M.. Mrs. Bill Mitchell, Santa 
Rosa. N.M.. both aunts of the 
honoree. Shirley Lewis, Lub­
bock and Brenda Sudduth. Dry 
Prong. La., both cousins of the 
honoree.
Hostess gift was a Cuisinant 

Food Processor.
Hostesses were Mrs. Lee Dun­

bar. Mrs Bvron Gwyn. Mrs. 
Dave Sudduth. Mrs Frank 
Ellis. Mrs Haney Poynor. Mrs. 
Kenneth Precure. Mrs. Roy 
Farley. Mrs. Hilbert Wisian. 
Mrs. Keith Taylor. Mrs. Paul 
Poynor, Mrs. Rowena Watson. 
Mrs. J.E. McVicker. Mrs. David 
Hamblen. Mrs. Gordon Murrah 
and Mrs. Reagan Cox.

*****
Houses with light-colored sides 

and roofs, smooth exterior sur­
faces and drawn drapes reflect 
sunlight and heat to make them 
cooler inside, advises Glenda 
Moore, housing and home furn­
ishings specialist, with the Tex­
as Agricultural Extension Serv­
ice. The Texas A&M University 
System.

*****
Research indicates most wo­

men who work away from home 
do so out of necessity- only 
seven per cent said they work to 
keep busy, reports Debby John­
son. family lefe education spec­
ialist. with the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service. The 
Texas A&M University System.

*** * *
Most old people in the United 

States seem to hold negative 
views toward aging, ihcmsel- 
ves--and life in general. They 
share these negative views with 
the young, although it appears 
that old people are no more or 
less gloomy about age than are 
young people, according to Mrs. 
Vivian Blair, family life educa­
tion specialist-aging, with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service, The Texas A&M Uni- 
versitv Svstem.

Saturday, 
July 2
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Suit features flared 
legged Western pants, 
with hip length back 
zipped pullover top The 
boat necked sleeveless 
top has detailed back 
yoke, belt loops, self 
belt

P r i n t e d  p a t t e r n  
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pattern add 50C
handling and postage 
Send to

Dept. 451
Balla'i Pattarnx 

P 0  Box 8 4 1  D ept 
H u rtt. Texas 7 6 0 6 3

Jewelry 50 *-7 5 *-$ l Up
Noil Polish_______ 75*
Grob Bags_______ 75*
Sw eater s Reg 19.95 $6  
Bloases 8° 'X .> 'o $4.95
Gloves____________ $1
Hoedbags 30n'y $5

Charlie Soap. 
Hats 6° n|r
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Beads
Wiglets
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Charlie Powder $2.50

l # f  Diana S t .w a r t ,  R iclri Seaton, S he rri Pugh , 
Helen Lopez & Bernice HoIderman Help You 

With A Carefree Summer Hairstyle
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Piano Students Attend 
Convention In Ft. Worth

n
/

Sixteen piano students from 
Muleshoe traveled to Fort 
Worth to play in an ensemble 
number at the Texas Music 
Teachers Convention held June 
11 through 15. The students 
performed on the “ Texas and 
American Composer" program, 
which featured numbers written 
by these composers.
The local association selected 

as their composition to be 
played. “ Cuckoo Clock Blues" 
by David Karp of Southern 
Methodist University. Students

who played were selected by 
local competition in March and 
they had to pass the State 
Theory lest on their grade level 
in school.
Directing the ensemble num­

ber was Mrs. Jean Craft, local 
piano teacher. Students playing 
in the number were Sheila and 
Mark Jordon, Cindy Clayton, 
Tcna Landers, Keva Roming. ( 
Merri Hausmann, Sandra 
Speck. Brenda Clay, Michelle 
Agee, Rebecca Barber. Kelly

Hamblen, Mary Kathryn
Flowers, Kelley Walden, Terry 
Baker, Belli Harmon and Blenn 
( rail these are the students of 
Mrs. .lean (raft, Mrs. Sam 
Damron. Mrs. Kathy Jahay and 
Mrs Becky Jones. There were 
approximately 45 people in at­
tendance at the convention from 
Muleshoe, including a former 
Muleshoe teacher, Nona
Milner.
Jimmy Craft, organ pupil of 

Mrs. Damron, won second place 
in the Organ Competition held 
at this convention.

\
w a r

' V *  -  „  +  \  -
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MISS SANTIAGA LOZANO

Bridal Shower Fetes 
Miss Santiago Lozano

A bridal shower honoring Miss 
Santiaga Lozano, bride-elect of 
Javier Pena, was held Friday 
night, June 24, in the Muleshoe 
State Bank community room.
The serving table was laid with 

a white cloth. A centerpiece of 
blue and white daisies carried 
out the bride's chosen colors. A 
white cake trimmed in blue with 
two interlocking hearts reading, 
“ Santiaga and Javier", mints 
and nuts were served from 
silver and crystal appointments. 
Miss Elva Lozano and Mrs. 
Betty White served the guests. 
Miss Rosemary Fabelo and Miss 
Patricia Fabelo registered the 
guests.
Special guests were Miss Mar- 

garito Lozano of Lawton. Okla., 
and Miss Ramiero Perez of 
Edinburg.

Hostess gifts were a mixer, 
slow cooker, blender, three-

piece casserole set and a 
four-piece china set.

Hostesses for the occasion 
were Mrs. Joe Elizarrarez, Mrs. 
Lucy Lucero, Mrs. Frank Her­
nandez, Mrs. Gonzalo Lozano, 
Mrs. Cuerelio Gallegos, Mrs. 
Luis Guzman, Mrs. Mario Ped­
roza. Mrs. Malaquies Agundis. 
Mrs. Jesse Leal, Mrs. Doroteo 
Barron, Mrs. Heriberto Men­
doza. Mrs. Genaro Silguero. 
Mrs. Josie Boea. Mrs. Betty 
White. Miss Sally Castorena, 
Miss Elva Lozano, Mrs. Martin 
Alacron. Mrs. Joe T. Gonzales 
and Mrs. Joe Orozco.

The boy who learns to 
play a game fairly and 
squarely will seldom de­
velop into a crooked 
business man.

Vursing Home
News

By A n n it Brown

MRS DICKY HANKS

Gift Coffee Honors 
Mrs. Dicky Hanks

A gift coffee honored Mrs. 
Dicky Hanks in the home of 
Mrs. Joe Pat Wagnon Saturday 
morning, June 25.
The serving table was covered 

with an ecru cloth of linen and 
lace with silver and crystal 
appointments. The centepiece 
of cut flowers was in the bride's 
chosen colors of apricot and 
summer green.
Special guests were Mrs. 

Charles Hager, mother of (he 
honoree, and Mrs. Lee Delk,

sister of the honoree. both of 
Clovis, N.M., Mrs. Kenneth 
Hanks, mother-in-law of the 

honoree. and Mrs. Ruby Will 
mon.

Hostesses were Mrs. Roy 
Whitt. Mrs. James Crane, Mrs. 
Jess Winn, Mrs. Bill St. Clair, 
Mrs. Charles Flowers, Mrs. 
Kenneth Powell. Mr« . Ernestine 
Little, Mrs. Tim Campbell, Mrs. 
C.L. Saylor, Mrs. Joe Pat Wag­
non. Mrs. Herb Griffiths and 
Mrs. Mvron Pool II.

Roy Sikes of the Richland Hills 
Baptist Church came Wednes­
day morning and brought us a 
devotional that we all enjoyed.

» * * * «

A group from the Muleshoe 
Church came Sunday afternoon 
and sung several songs.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Schmitz 

from Eldorado visited his 
mother, Mrs. Onie McDaniel 
Saturday.

White Family 
Reunion Held 
In El Paso
The second annual White Fam­

ily Reunion was held in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Kaerwer in El Paso. Thurman 
White and three sisters of the 
W.H. White family of Wichita 
Falls were gathered for the 
occasion.
Those attending were Mr. and 

Mrs. Thurman White and 
daughter. Jerri, granddaughter, 
Tyree, and great grand­
daughter, Amanda; Mrs. Bea­
trice Rhea and daughter, 
LaWayne Kellum and children, 
Larry, Gary and Kim of Hous­
ton; Mr. and Mrs. Wimpy 
Walker. Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Kaerwer and Melissa of El 
Paso; Mr. and Mrs. Herman 
Meyer and Johnny, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Meyer and Halley of 
Burleson; Mr. and Mrs. Otis 
Stowe of Austin; Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Baird of Brownwood; 
Mr. and Mrs. James Rutledge 
of Wichita Falls; and Mr. and 
Mrs'. Bob Kaerwer of El Paso.

PIANO STUDENTS...These 16 Muleshoe piano students performed at the Texas Music Teachers 
Association in Fort Worth. It was held June II to 15. Those attending were Sheila Jordon. Mark Jordan, 
Cindy Clayton, Tena Landers, Keva Roming, Merri Hausmann, Sandra Speck. Brenda Clay, Michelle 
Agee, Rebecca Barber, Kelly Hamblen, Mary Kathryn Flowers, Kelley Walden, Terry Baker, Beth 
Harmon and Blenn Craft.

Mrs. Onie McDaniel had as her 
guests last week Mrs. Dana 
Arnold and daughter, Dana, 
Mr. and Mrs. Moody Moore, 
Mrs. Beverly Hall of Friona, 
Mr. and Mrs. Garland Young, 
Claude Coffman and Mrs. Beaty 
of Muleshoe. Mr. and Mrs, 
Rudolph Moraw visited Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Jude Muller of 
Littlefield. Mr. and Mrs. Sher­
man Inman, Mrs. Mildred Nee­
ly, Mrs. Ruby Garner and Mrs. 
Betty Jackson all visited Mrs. 
Bray Sunday afternoon.

*****
Mrs. Sybil Simpson came last 

Tuesday and took her mother, 
Mrs. Annie Brown, to Lubbock 
to visit her brother and wife, 
Mr. and Mrs. L.C. Hill. Mrs. 
Hill is a resident of University 
Convalescent Home.

Jackson. Mrs. Rosie McKillip, 
Mrs. Ona Berry, Mrs. Carrie 
Boydstun. Mrs. Onie McDaniel 
and Ernest Green.

*****
Thursday we celebrated Mrs. 

Mildred McDaniel's birthday. 
Music was furnished by Zeb 
Robinson. The Needmore wo­

men came and served cake and 
punch.

Deep
Worry is a stream of 

fear, cutting a gorge 
through the weary mind.

-Grit.

Mr. and Mrs. A.R. Hill of 
Seymour visited his sister. Mrs. 
Annie Brown Saturday.

* • • • •
Mrs. Ona Berry visited her 

brother, Arthur Perkins Sunday
afternoon.

Those playing "42” Tuesday 
were Miss Marie Engram, Wal­
ter Damron. Mrs. Mae Wilterd- 
ing. Arthur Perkins, Zeb Robi­
son, Tommy Berry, Mrs. Betty

y>b

SERVING YOUR NEEDS FOR 24 YEARS

s

S I D E W A L K
C o v in g s *

Sot., July 2

Come In  Where 
It's Cool & See 
Our Hot Special

Jlinduif'i Cicdit 
êweUif202 Mai* 272-33!

^ 'S U M M E R  CLEARANCE
SALE STARTS THURSDAY - JUNE 30th At 9:00 a.m

ANNIVERSARY GIFTS • BABY GIFTS • BABY JEWELRY •

ALL SALES FINAL 
NO LAYAWAYS j *
NO REFUND *
OR EXCHANGES

SELECT GROUP  
MEN'S

SUITS-SP0RTC0ATS

$

Regulars -  Longs 
Solids and Patterns 

R E G  $48 TO $140

3 2 00 to *9 3 34
MEN’S

SPORT SHIRTS
* Short Sleeve -  Tapered
* Perma Press
* Full C u t-  Tall Man -  Regular

R EG $8 TO $14

* 3 4  IO*934
/MEN'S

DRESS SLACKS
Farah and Levi
Solids -  Fancy - 100% Polyester 
Size 30-44 

REG $12 TO $25

*8® ° io *l 6 67
LONG SLEEVE

JEAN SHIRTS
Asst. Prints 

Poly ./Cotton
REG $12- $20

TO $13.34

COMPLETE STOCK 
MEN'S

SWIMWEAR
Asst. Styles

REG $4 - | 8

$2.67 TO 
$5.34

272-4453

INFANT

SPORTSWEAR
Buobles -  Sun Suits - SwimWear 
Sizes S-M -L-X L

REG $4.25 - $8 .50

TO
$ 5 70

B O Y ’S

TANK TOPS-SWIMWEAR
REG $2.59 TO $5 .50

‘l75 ,0 *367
S P E C IA L  GROUP  

M E N ’S

DRESS SHOES
City Club - Nunn Bush

REG $22 - $36

PRICE
SPECIAL GROUP  

MEN'S

KNIT
SHIRTS

Short Sleeve
R E G  $5 TO $15

'/ , o n

lAD ieS

WHITE
SHOES

Dress Styles

1/3 OFF

GIRLS
SPORTSWEAR

Tops -  Pants - Shorts 
Sizes 4-14
R E G  $1.98 - $14.00

TO

LADIES

$1

LADIES
NYLON

SLEEPWEAR
Gowns - Shorties -  Robes

R E G  $7 TO $32

TO

SPORTSWEAR
This Group Consists of Pants, Blouses, Gaucho 
and Skirts

R E G  $10 TO $24

* 6 6 7 ,0 * 1 6 ° °

GIRLS l  TODDLER
DRESSES

Assorted Styles and Patterns

R E G  $7 .50  TO $28
Sizes I to 14

TO

LADIES - JUNIOR

DRESSES
Short or Long Length

REG $15 TO $64

*1000IO*4267

O V E R  1600

PATTERNS
Simplicity - M cCalls

PRICE

g i r l s

BRA l  PANTY
» * • * '  SET

JUNIOR

SPORTSWEAR
Pants - Tops - Halters - Shorts

REG $4 TO $22

* 2 * 7  * 1 4 * 7

St»@CcU/t&

SUMMER

JEWELRY

k  PRICE

S P E C IA L
G R O U P

ACCESSORIES
Hats -  Belts - Caps - 

Handbags

H  OFF
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The Lieutenant Governor’s Report
By Bill Hobby

AUSTIN -  In discussing 
tbe highlights of the 65th 
Legislature, 1 have found 
that no single bill attracts 
more interest than the 
Appropriations Bill. The 
65th Legislature approved 
an appropriation of $15.5 
billion from all funds for 
support of state govern­
ment in the 1978-79 
biennium. Enactment of 
school finance legislation, 
which must be considered 
in special session, could 
push the state budget for 
the 1978-79 biennium to a 
total of over $16 billion, 
an increase of $3.5 billion 
over the total appropria­
tions enacted by the 64th 
Legislature for the current 
1976-77 biennium.

The Department of 
Public Welfare will receive 
$30 million each fiscal

year tor day care; $55.1 
million in fiscal ’78 and 
$55.3 million in fiscal ’79 
for in-home care activity 
of the Community Care 
for the Aged, Blind and 
Disabled Program; and, 
Aid to Families with 
Dependent Children reci­
pients will be given a 
$5.00 monthly amount to 
be paid on a nonrecurring 
semiannual basis.

The Texas Department 
of Mental Health and 
Mental Retardation will 
receive $280 million to 
operate 13 schools for the 
mentally retarded which 
will enable the Depart­
ment to begin operations 
of the San Antonio State 
School with admissions to 
begin in the spring of
1 9 7 8  . . .It also received

$207 million to operate

eight state mental hospi­
tals and $82 million in 
grants-in-aid to commun-

H u m s
» p j

GRACE WINN

Grace T. Winn 
Funeral Rites 

Held Wednesday
Winn. 83, were conducted at the 
First Baptist Church in Mule- 
shoe Wednesday at 10:30 a.m. 
Officiating was J.E. Meeks, 
pastor.

Burial was in Muleshoe Ceme­
tery under direction of 
Singleton-Ellis Funeral Home. 

Mrs. Winn died in West Plains 
Medical Center in Muleshoe on 
Sunday at 6:20 p.m. following a 
lengthy illness. She was born 
May 9, 1894 in Bangs, Tex., and 
had been a resident of Bailey 
County since 1915, moving here 
from Brown County. Her hus­
band, Daniel Welton Winn, 
preceded her in death in 1955. 
She was a member of the First 
Baptist Church of Muleshoe. 
Survivors include two sons, 

Jess, Muleshoe and Weldon B., 
Moab, Utah; two sisters, Mrs. 
Olicc Jones, Rising Star, Tex. 
and Mrs. Treacy Fielder, 
Bangs. Tex.; two brothers, 
Dean Brooks, Bangs, Tex. and 
R.L. Brooks, Jr., Lubbock; 
seven grandchildren and six 
great-grandchildren.

Army admits germ warfare 
on civilians.

ity mental health and 
mental retardation centers.

The Texas Department 
of Health Resources will 
receive a total appropria­
tion of $141.7 million for 
the 1978-79 biennium 
including $30.2 million 
for the operation of three 
state chest hospitals. 
Major areas of increased 
funding are in the crippled 
children and kidney health 
care programs to provide 
for expanded caseloads 
and increased medical

DroughtR educed
Migrant Work 
In Northwest
Texas migrant workers who arc 

thinking of going to the North­
west for the harvests there had 
better think twice this year.
That is the word from Milton 

G. Klein, director of the Idaho 
Department of Health and Wel­
fare.

Klein told Texas Welfare Com­
missioner Raymond W. Vowell 
that Idaho is expecting a severe 
drought this summer.

“This will have a serious effect 
upon the number of agriculture 
jobs which will be available in 
the State of Idaho," said Klein. 

"We are already receiving 
reports that a higher than usual 
number of migrant laborers are 
coming to Idaho thinking that 
work will be available here. 
Actually, there will be much less 
work available in Idaho than 
there is normally.

"I think it is our duty to inform 
migrant laborers that work is 
not available in this state to save 
them the expense of making the 
trip to Idaho. To do so would 
simply serve to further deplete 
the limited resources which 
many of these people have,” 
Klein concluded.
Vowell said that Texas State 

Welfare Department staff 
throughout the state will be 
notified so they can advise 
migrant workers or their fam 
ilies who receive Texas Welfare 
services of the situation in 
Idaho.
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COME JOIN 
THE FUN IN 
MULESHOE

JUNIOR RODEO
J u ly  1-2

8:00 p.m.
M uleshoe Roping Arena

PONY EXPRESS
Monday, July 4 

7:30 a.m.
N eedm ore To M u lesh oe

MULESHOE PITCHING
9:00 a.m. 

Courthouse Lawn

KIDS ACTIVITIES
10:00 a.m. 

Courthouse Square

Bicycle Races, Dart Throw, Potato Baca
Skateboard Ridiag, 

3-Legged Race

Mony-Meay Kara

Ages M l

OLD
REI
2:0  

Fellow  sh 
First M et

SETTLERS 
UNION f
0 p.m. *
ip  H all O f The 1 
hodist Church $

PARADE i
4 :00  p.m. j 

Fieats-Riding Clehs-Old C irs-E tc. }
Begins A t The Boy Scout Hut }

+

ENTERTAINMEN
" 6 * * 4  D «rk”

Siagiag l  Fireworks
A t The New C ity Park

r i

t**

COUNTY FAIR
9:00 a.m. 

Courthouse Lawn
HaaiaaiaBa lea C roon*

Saft Driaks-Deakiag Board- 
Tenb llag-H ebby I  C raft D isp lay  
D row iags-A rt Show-Sheet Sheet- 

la k ia g  C o ito s t-F e o d i Of A ll Typei

First National
Bank

*  MEMBER F.D.I.C. J

costs.
Forty million dollars 

is appropriated to the 
Texas Department of 
Corrections for a prison 
hospital to he located on 
the campus of the U.T. 
Medical Branch at Gal­
veston along with $38 
million for additional 
prison units.

In appropriating funds 
to community colleges, 
the legislature used actual 
base period enrollments 
rather than projections 
which resulted in a 
decrease of about $45 
million. A contingency 
fund of $3.4 million in 
1978 and $7.9 million 
in 1979 is included for 
four new campuses.

For the first time, the 
general academic formulas 
were utilized to fund 
Texas’ eight upper level 
institutions. In addition 
to the formula amounts, a 
Contingency Fund for 
Growth was included in 
the Coordinating Board 
amounting to $2.8 million 
for the biennium. These 
funds may be spent only 
on faculty salaries, depart­
mental operating expense 
and instructional adminis­
tration.

In the area of public 
education, the bill pro­
vides funding for pilot 
programs for physical 
evaluation of school child­
ren, and increased funds 
for adult basic education

Gaylord Freeman, Chair­
m an, P osta l Study 
Commission;
“ M ail delivery  six 

days a week is an extrava­
gance that the U.S. can no 
longer afford.”

Edward Brooke, Senator 
(R-Mass):
“ Congress must pass 

an overall energy bill, not 
just the popular parts.”

Three Way
News

By Mrs. H.W. Garvin

Dinner guests in the H.W. 
Garvin home Sunday were Mr. 
and Mrs. Woodrow Chamber- 
lian from Ft. Worth, Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Fox and daughter 
from Clovis and Rev. and Mrs. 
James Gillenline from Lubbock. 

* * * * *
Mr. and Mrs. D.S. Fowler were 
dinner guests in the Buddy Cook 
home in Morton Sunday. 

*****

Rev. Gary Martin from Lub­
bock was the guest speaker at 
Three Way Baptist Church Sun­
day. Rev. Vernon Stephens and 
family, the pastor of Three Way, 
is on vacation.

Mrs. Sally Robinson spent last 
weekend in Dallas attending a 
family reunion.

The community received rain 
the past week which was badly 
needed. Amounts from one and 
one half to two inches was 
received. Farmers arc very busy 
in the Fields now.

*****
Mr and Mrs. D.S. Fowler 

were in Lubbock Friday night 
and soon! the night with the Ray 
Fowlers. They also visited his 
sister Mrs. Troy Wilkcrson who
is a patient in a hospital.

*****
We wish to welcome the Loyd 

Gilley family to our community. 
Mr. Gilley is the manager of 
Stale line Butane Company at 
Maple.

Mr. and Mrs. James Fowler 
and family from Lubbock spent 
Saturday night with his parents 
the D.S. Fowlers.

Irate Husband; 
"Light bill, water bill, 

gas bill, milk bill-you've 
got to quit th is wild 
spending!"

-Anchor. Kev West.

Sweet Oblivion 
Perhaps if we could 

forget our tro u b le s  as 
easily as our blessings we 
would live belter.

-Morning News. Dalas.

Loiboddio
M m I
J h i i

Crosado
l i l y  17-14, 1*71

programs and regional pro­
grams for severely handi­
capped children.

Legislation consolidat­
ing the three separate 
water agencies into one 
new agency titled the 
Department of Water Re­
sources anticipates a bien­
nial savings of approxi­
mately $3.5 million it. 
general revenue through 
increased efficiency and 
elimination of duplicative 
functions.

Our six state medical 
school units are funded to 
achieve the maximum en­
rollments in all class levels.

Classrrxjiri buildings are 
funded at the University 
of Texas Health Science 
( enter at San Antonio to 
accommodate expanded 
classes and finish present 
building expansion pro­
grams.

The General Appropria­
tions Bill allocates funds 
to many more areas than 
are mentioned here, but 
this brief discussion gives 
an idea of the scope and 
variety of programs 
funded by the State of 
Texas.

House approves $4-billion 
public works job program.

NOTES,COMMENT
Why is it that the truth 

is so painful at times.'
* * • *

N ever expect good 
luck to make up lor loaf­
ing.

* * « «
Kindness has never 

yet done anyone serious 
harm. ______
Henry Jackson, Senator

(D-Wash):
“ The President’s pro­

posals for gasoline tax in­
creases to encourage con­
servation of fuel are im­
practical.”

FOOD MARKED
USDA
Agricultural Marketing Service L̂ERT
As of mid-June, the supply situation in July is expected to look like 
this .
RED MEATS
Beet plentifu l P rodu ction  to 
average about 4 -6%  below  the  
record levels o l a year earlie r but 
about 4%  above the 1974-76  
average lo r the  m onth S m aller 
o u tp u t  o t  g r a s s - te d  b e e t  
accounts tor most ot the  decline  
from  y ear-earlier levels 
Pork adequate  P rodu ction  
rates will be dow n seasonally, 
but should  average 8 -10%  h igher 
than low levels o f a year a g o a n d  
about 8% above the 1974-76  
average tor the m onth  
POULTRY « EGGS 
Broiler-fryers adequate  July  
production rates up about 5%  
trom  last year and about 13%  
higher than the  Ju ly  1974-76  
average
Eggs adequate  J u ly o u tp u tto  
be 1% above a year earlier and  
the July 1974-76 average as well 
Turkeys adequate  July
productions are dow n 3%  trom  
year-earlier levels but 3% above  
the m ost recent 3 -y e a r average  
for July Ju ly  1 co ld  storage h o ld ­
ings above last year's level, but 
dow n about 12 m illion pounds  
trom the July 1974-76 average  
As a result, Ju ly  turkey  supply  
will be a little  above year-esrlier  
levels
MILK A DAIRY PRODUCTS 
Milk and dairy products
plentifu l M ilk p roduction  in July  
will be past its seasonal p e a k . but 
above the July 1976 level and the  
Ju ly 1974-76 average D airy  
p r o d u c ts ,  a ls o  p a s t th e ir  
seasonal peak, w ill continue  
heavy.
In M ay, accord ing  to p relim inary  
figures, butler production  was 
m ore than 16% h igher than * in  
M ay o( last year C om m ercia l 
stocks w ere  35%  above M ay 1, 
1976 and 10% above the 1974-76  
average fo r M ay 1 A m erican  
cheese production  was 6%  
a b o v e  M a y  o f la s t y e a r  
C om m ercia l stocks w ere up 27%

from  M ay 1 ,1 9 7 6  and 13% above  
the M ay 1, 1974-76 average In 
April, nonfat dry milk production  
was 22% higher than A pril of last 
year and 10% above the 1974-76  
A pril level On M ay 1, dry milk 
m anufacturers slocks w ere 42%  
above M ay 1, 1976 and 10%  
above the latest 3-year average  
fo r that date
FRUIT. VEGETABLES « NUTS 
Fresh non-citrus fruits. Fresh
peaches plentifu l This
season's production  excluding  
C a lifo rn ia  clingstones w hich are  
used m ainly  tor canning  to Be 
slightly above 1976 and 10% 
larger than 1975 Plums 
plentifu l C aliforn ia's  c ro p  is 
forecast 17% above Iasi season  
and 9% above 1975 Nectarines 

. p lentifu l. This year's C a li­
forn ia  crop  is estim ated  at 6%  
less than last season s record  but 
13% above 1975 production  
Bartlett pears adequate  Early  
forecast of the com bined  crop in 
C a l i f o r n i a .  O r e g o n  a n d  
W ashington indicates 6% less 
than last year's total p roduction, 
but 9% greater than 1975 
Apricots adequate The 1977 
crop to  b e s h g h tly b e lo w las ty e a r  
and 19% below  the 1975 crop  
Sweet cherries light. P ro­
duction ot sweet cherries in 7 
W estern states forecast at nearly  
one-th ird  below  last year and 8%  
less than  1975's sm all crop  
Fresh citrus trulls. Lemons 
plentifu l As of June 1, lem ons  
rem ain ing  for harvest trom  the 
1976-77 crop w ere 30%  above the  
y ear-earlier level. Limes . .lig h t. 
E s t im a t e d  1 9 7 7 - 7 8  l im e  
production  indicates the crop  
will be dow n 38%  from  last 
season. This  w ill be sm allest., 
crop  since 1966-67 Oranges 
adequate  Harvest of C alifo rm a s 
V alencia crop as of June 1 was 
about 10% com plete; harvest of 
C a lifo rn ia  Navels and oranges  
produced in F lorida and o ther 
states was nearly finished

Dried prunes adequate
C a li fo r n ia  1 9 7 6  p ro d u c tio n  
totaled som e 3% less than 1975 
but 3% above th f 1974 crop  
Raisins light The 1976
proauction  was m uch lower than
1975 production
Frozen vegetable Supply 
generally  adequate but w ith few  
item s p lentifu l Apr 30 holdings  
of Irozen cut corn and corn-on- 
cob w ere 13% and 31% above 
average T h e  Irozen French 
tried potato inventory was 14% 
above average C arryoverstocks  
of principal canned vegetables  
adequate Increas in g su p p lieso t 
new 1977 pack vegetables will 
becom e availab le  in July  
Fresh potatoes and onloni 
adequate  Watermelons 
plentifu l and at a sum m er peak 
Peanuts . p lentifu l. C o m ­
m ercia l stocks on Apr 30 w ere  
18% low er than a year earlier, but 
1977 production  totaled only 3%  
less than the record  1975 crop  
Almonds p le n t i f u l
C aliforn ia's  1976 crop was 
record high w ith  production  
about 44%  h igher than the 1975 
cro p  Walnuts plentifu l The
1976 production  was 7% less 
than the 1975 crop  Pecans 
light
GRAINS AND LEGUMES 
Rice plentifu l Early forecasts  
tor the 1977-78 crop  predict 97- 
I d  m illion cwt. as opposed to  
the 117 m illion cwt. p roduced in 
1976 T h e  i9 7 6 c ro p w a s o n ly 9 %  
less than the previous year s 
crop, but was p roduced on 11%  
few er acres
Wheat plentifu l. W ith harvest 
only now beg inn ing  the 1977-78  
w heat c ro p  is forecast at 1.900- 
2.150  m illion bushels approxi­
m ating last y e a rs  record crop  
of 2  147 m illion bushels Coupled  
with the largest carryover since  
1963. this cou ld  produce the  
largest w heat supply on record

Byrd wants water projects 
continued.

SIDEWALK
C ra v in g s*
-  — -------------

Saturday, July 2

Kitchen Aid Dishwasher
B tilt  In 
Model
IDC-17

2 Only
* 2 7 8 ° °

Tappaa
Microwave Oven
With Variable Cook Ceatrel

$31995
9”  Z e iitli B t  W
T.V . $88

23” Zenith Color-Used
T.V. $148

Regeocy Model 185
95C.B. Radio $79

8 Track Recording Tapes Vi Price

IViC&on m
Applia nces

S f o r e  Hours8  a . m . - 6 pm At on. -Saf .  2 7 2 - 5 5 3 1

P'H "TV"!

117 Main
i



Danny Davis Will Perform During Fair
Muleshoe Journal, Thursday, June 30, 1977, Pcge 7

Signed contracts confirming 
the appearance of Danny Davis 
and the Nashville Brass at the 
60th annual Panhandle South 
Plains Fair have been returned, 
Steve L. Lewis, general mana­
ger. announced Saturday (June 
25).

Lewis said signing of the 
popular aggregation to its first 
stint at the fair t arked the 
beginning of a search to find a 
slate of family entertainment to 
headline the exposition, sche­
duled September 24 • October 1. 
Three other shows are being 

negotiated. Free entertainment 
will be provided in the Fair Park 
Coliseum on closing Saturday, 
Lewis added. That lineup will be 
announced nearer fair time. 

Davis and the Brass have been 
signed to do only two shows--at 
3:30 p.m. and 7:30 p.m.-on 
September 26.

Matinees will be scheduled 
only for Davis and the Brass and 
for the Sunday, September 25, 
date, Lewis said.

Directors decided during the 
winter that since week-day mat­
inees had not been drawing, 
they would be limited in the 
future.

“ For instance," Lewis pointed 
out "Charley Pride" holds the 
house record for a single perfor­

mance (5.510), yet he drew no 
more than 1100 at a week-day 
matinee.
Selection of Davis and the 

Brass was from a field of a 
dozen artists, whittled by Lewis 
and the board of directors from 
a host of potential shows.
The appearance of Davis and 

his group coincides with area 
school day, which also features 
the highly popular Parade of 
Bands in downtown Lubbock. 
"The Hard Travelers," an 

aggregation from Lubbock 
Christian College, will be on the 
bill with Davis and company. 
The Davis group has been 

rocking along since 1968, when 
their first album sold 380,000 
copies within six months after it 
was released.

In 1969, the group won a 
Grammy award for “ Kawliga.” 

That same year and for six 
consecutive years thereafter,

they received the Country Music 
Association's best instrumental 
group of the year award.
They have consistently been 

voted Country Music's most 
popular instrumental group by 
all three major trade 
magazines-Billboard, Cashbox 
and the Record World.
They have performed often at 

the White House and on nation­
al television and they were first 
to take country music to Las 
Vegas.
And, in 1974, they delivered 

the first taste of country at 
Chicago's London House, highly 
acclaimed for its jazz music.

Problems
Two great American 

mysteries: "Who does th«j 
umpire boo?” and “ Who 
listens to the bartender's 
troubles.”

-Star, Kansas City.

Davis was a proficient trumpet­
er at the age of 14 and was 
soloist with the Massachusetts 
All Slate Symphony in his early

teens. Aliciidirg the New Kng- 
lant!Conservatory of Music on a 
scholarship, he landed his first 
job playing with an orchestra 
upon graduation.
Tickets for his show will be 

available in mid-August,

Cotton Group Praises 
Action On Cotton Dust

Vacation Wear 
Means Better Health
The traditional summer vaca­

tion of the American family is 
highly recommended by your 
doctor. The family needs to get 
away from customary home and 
office chores, forget day-to-day 
worries for a short time and 
generally get rejuvenated and 
ready to face another year.
Whether your vacation will be 

a short trio to a nearby lake, 
camping out in a national park, 
a plane trip abroad, or what 
have you, there are a few things 
to keep in mind that will help 
avoid having the holiday spoiled

Bank Deposits Show Strength
Strength of the Texas economy 

shows in the growth of bank 
deposits.

Deposits at Texas banks total­
ed $53 billion at the end of last 
year. Three years before, they

totaled $38.6 billion.
A gain of over 37 percent, that 

is close to twice the rate of 
increase nationwide.
Across the country as a whole, 

deposits increased from $682

Attend the Church 
of Your Choice 
Every Sunday

billion in late 1973 to $816 
billion in late 1976. That was a 
gain of less than 20 percent. 
With the increase in business, 

which slowed comparatively lit­
tle in Texas during the reces­
sion, demand deposits were up 
a hefty $4.4 billion. But the big 
increase was in interest-bearing 
deposits, which expanded $10 
billion.

At the end of 1973, demand 
deposits totaled $20 billion. 
Time and savings accounts to­
taled $18.6 billion.
Three years later, the relative 

importance of these two general 
types of deposits had been 
reversed. Demand deposits to­
taled more than $24.4 billion. 
But time and savings accounts 
totaled nearly $28.6 billion. 

Where demand deposits had 
expanded 22 percent, time and 
savings deposits expanded 54 
percent.

Most of the increase came from 
growth in personal and business 
accounts.

Banks, which also hold balan­
ces. made net additions to their 
accounts, as did all levels of 
government. And some foreign 
banks and governments increas­
ed their balances in Texas 
banks.
Altogether, year-end totals for 

these deposits that do not 
belong to individuals and busi­
nesses rose from $8.5 billion in 
1973 to $11 billion in 1976.
But balances held by people 

and businesses increased faster. 
From $30.1 billion in 197.1, the 
year-end total increased to $42 
billion in 1976.
That was a 40 percent increase 

in private accounts, compared 
with a 29 percent increase in 
other accounts.

* * •  •
News isn ’t alw ays 

w hat h a p p e n s ;i t 's  w hat 
you happen to read or 
hear.

• * •  *
A diet may be good for 

the health, but a good 
m enu can do w onders 
also.

<S(i

by illness.
Depending on where you're 

going, you may need some 
vaccination shots. Tetanus, cer­
tainly for anyone who expects to 
include some out-of-doors acti­
vities. Typhoid, if your journey 
includes areas where the water 
supply is uncertain. Ask your 
doctor about these, and possibly 
other immunizations.
The American Medical Asso­

ciation suggests that you remind 
yourself to use common sense 
about your vacation diet. Many 
a family trip has been spoiled by 
too many roadside hamburgers 
and soft drinks. A sound rule 
while driving crosscountry is to 
eat lightly. Be cautious about 
heavy, rich meals, particularly if 
you're not accustomed to such 
fare at home.

Know what sort of climate you 
will encounter at your vacation 
spot and dress accordingly. It 
can get cold in the mountains at 
night, even in midsummer. 
Good walking shoes are impor­
tant to the travel wardrobe.
If you wear glasses, take along 

an extra pair. Or at least a copy 
of your prescription. If you're 
taking a regular medication, 
make certain of your supply 
before you leave.

And, finally, don't overdo it. 
Almost no one other than a 
trained athlete is ready for 36 
holes of golf or five sets of 
tennis under a broiling sun. 
Schedule your vacation to allow 
daily rest periods. Do most of 
the driving in the morning hours 
and stop for the day in early or 
mid-afternoon.
Your vacation should be a 

holiday for rest and relaxation. 
It should not be a grind that 
necessitates another vacation to 
rest up from the vacation.

* * * *
We have no way of 

knowing, but prices will 
probably  be high next
year.

•  * •  •
The matter of your 

health should be more 
important than anything
else to yoû _

National Cotton Council Presi­
dent Jack G. Stone today prais- 
the Council on Wage and Price 
Stability (CWPS) for its con­
structive alternatives regarding 
a proposed new cotton dust 
standard.
The President's inflation­

fighting agency, in a report 
recently filed with the Occupa­
tional Safety and Health Admin­
istration. cited the cost impact 
of the proposed industrywide 
standard. It said a more 
cost-effective yet protective ap­
proach would be to establish 
different dust levels for the 
industry's various processing 
stages.

"The Cotton Council has long 
maintained that a single indus­
trywide standard is totally un­
reasonable since cotton dust 
varies considerably in composi­
tion and toxicity from one 
processing stage to another," 
Stone said.
The California producer said 

he was pleased that CWPS 
recognized the inflationary im­
pact of OSHA's proposal, and 
recommended approaches 
which "might more closely fol­
low the instruction and intent of 
the OSHA act.”

Stone commented. "OSHA 
seems to think anyone suggest­
ing consideration of costs is 
putting money over human 
health and safety. This is not 
true, of course. No one would 
deny that worker safety must 
have prime consideration, but 
workers should be afford­
ed protection in the most 
cost-effective way.”

He also noted that CWPS calls 
for more emphasis on identify­
ing the unknown agent that 
causes byssinosis, and des­
cribes the disease as being 
"imperfectly associated" with 
cotton dust.

“ We in the cotton industry 
question the wisdom of impos­
ing a dust standard throughout 
our industry when nobody yet 
knows exactly what causes bys­
sinosis or whether the disease 
actually exists in all sectors," 
the Cotton Council president 
said.
Stone pointed out that the 

industry has been giving the 
byssinosis problem top priority 
since 1972. He said extensive 
research programs have been 
stimulated in the U S Depart­
ment of Agriculture, the Nation­

al Institute for Occupational 
Safety and Health, state univer­
sities, textile trade associations, 
and individual textile mills. In 
addition, cotton producers 
themselves have invested mil­
lions of dollars in byssinosis 
research.

"Testimony presented during 
public hearings on the proposed 
standard encourages us to be­
lieve that within two years or so 
a fraction of the dust that 
contains the byssinotic agent or 
agents may be identified," 
Stone said. "If so, we would 
have a far better basis for 
deactivating the dust or--at the 
very least- for establishing a 
more reasonable, less costly 
standard that would provide 
worker protection.

"We will continue to give this 
effort top priority, and I know 
we will succeed if we are given 

Not So Bad
What is the difference be­

tween a cloud and a beaten 
child?

One pours with rain and 
the other roars with pain.

No Time To Grow
Mrs. Noowel-Aren't these 

eggs rather small today?
G rocer-Y es’m, but the 

farmer who sells me my eggs 
had to start to town early this 
morning and took them out of 
the nest too soon.

the time to do so, " .Stone added. 
"When that is accomplished, an 
intelligent standard can be de­
veloped."

Boy’s Ranch 
Gets Check 
From Speaker

The second of two $6,000 
checks from House Speaker Bill 
Clayton to children's homes in 
his legislative d'strict will be 
presented Sunday (June 26). 
Clayton, who is state repre­

sentative of District 74, will 
make the contribution to Boy's 
Ranch at Old Tascosa. The 
presentation will be to Virgil 
Patterson, ranch president, fol­
lowing the II a.m. church 
service and conducted on the 
chapel's steps.
Girlstown at Whiteface receiv­

ed a check for a similar amount 
in a presentation June 12.
The money is the total of 

contributions presented Clayton 
by friends and employees at 
Speaker's Day observance dur­
ing the recently concluded legis­
lative Session.
No stipulations as to use of the 

funds was made by Clayton, 
who indicated that it could 
either be used for general 
expenses or for special projects 
the homes might undertake.

We Will Be

Closed
July 4-11

Thank You
J L m b a t  d lto M U

123 Mala 272-4726
Jbooooooooooooooooooooooooeooooooooooooooooc?

Now Open
Lee’s Western Wear

1910 
W. Alter. 

Blvd.

You’ll Find Rugged Jeans , Quality 
Crafted Boots, Plus A Whole Group 

Of Accessories In The Distinctive 
Western Styles You Want! 

Come Take A Look.

O &■

W rangler A Levi Jeans
Resistol A Bailey Hats 

Panhandle Slim, TemTex,
Champion, Dixon Jenkins Shirts 
Tony Lama, Jastin, Necona,
Mustang ,  Acme A Sheyenne Boots 
Jastin Belts 
Potts Longhorn Tack

s , 0 >

. V '

'1910 W. Amt r. Blvd.

11 ee’s ̂vvestêĵjwear
Mult s h o *

/

2 7 2 -4 6 6 3

TheThreeWay Cheerleaders &Twirlers 
Are NowSellingSubscriptionsToThe 
Muleshoe& Bailey County Journals, 
Through July 15.

I I  Yon Hovn’t Been Contacted, Yea May Contact:

JanSimpson
Sheryl Waldtrip 
M itiz Robertson 
Christy Foagley
Henna Warren 
Susan Dapler 
Mary Jo Dapler

The Girls W ill ft eceive 35
Of Any Renewels & 50%
Of Any New Subscriptions.

Help The Girls Outl 
Subscribe Today 1

Muleshoe &
Bailey County

Journals
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Tips On H ow- To Beal The Heal!
You can't really beat the heat. 
Whether it’s the heal or the 
umidily. or bolh. it’s hoi in 
ImoNi all of ihe United Stales in

July. After weeks of sweating 
and steaming, it's not uncom- 
mon to find the heat is begin­
ning to wear you down.

M .D . Lo worn 
Dirt Moving

TAILWATER PITS 

LANDLEVEUNG DAMS

25 Years In This Ana

Bex 544, Faraell, Texas 
Pkoae (BOS) 481-9029

You ean'l do anything about 
the outside temperature. You 
ean avoid it if you're fortunate 
enough lo work and live in 
air-eondilioned comfort, but it 
still will he hot outside.
The American Medical Asso­

ciation points out that there are 
some things you ean do to be 
more eomforlahle -lhings that 
can help you heal the heat.
Stay out of Ihe sun as much as 

possible, especially during the 
middle of the day when rays are 
hottest. Wear light, loose cloth­
ing. The ladies have the edge 
over Ihe men in this respect. 
Drink more liquids than usual, 
but lake extra salt only on your 
physician's advice, particularly 
if you have liver or kidney 
trouble or a heart condition.
Take a shower or dip in the 

pool once or twice a day to cool 
off. Gel plenty of rest and sleep. 
Eat your regular diet and don't

Price* food thru July 2, 1977. We reserve the right to limit 
quantities. None sold to dealers.

go overlxiaril on cold cuts and 
salads, unless you like them 
anyway.
Gel up early in Ihe morning to 

do your heavy work on Ihe lawn 
or garden. Or work at dusk in 
Ihe evening, hut try lo avoid 
heavy exertion during Ihe hot­
test hours of Ihe day. There is 
sound physical reason behind 
Ihe siesta custom of Ihe tropics.

You need exercise in the 
summer as well as in Ihe winter, 
but don't overdo it, especially 
on extra hot days. Don't overdo 
physical exertion, whether at 
work or at play.
The more relaxed outdoor life 

of the summer months has many 
advantages lo compensate for 
the heal. Slay relaxed and use 
eommon sense and you ean beat 
the heal-at least somewhat.

Energy panel supports 
federal oil imports.

View From 
The Plain

by J.D. Peer 
I & K Field Officer

SAH HOA IING WEEK
Governor Dolph liriseoe has 

proclaimed July .1-9 as "Safe 
Boating Week."
In the proclamation. Ihe gov­

ernor cited the importance of 
boating safety as individuals 
head lor the many lakes and 
streams across Texas.

Figures compiled by Ihe lexas 
Parks and Wildlife Department, 
the water safely regulating 
agency, show over 498,8X9 
boats registered by April 1977 in 
Texas.

With this number of boats 
ready lo hit Ihe water over the 
4th of July holiday weekend, the 
P&WI) predicts 25 individuals 
will lose their lives from water- 
related mishaps.

Ihe increase in Ihe number ol 
water lalalilics is climbing at a 
faster rale than the number of 
registered boats and' I’&WD 
wardens will he out in full force 
during Ihe holiday period.
The most flagrant violation 

noted by Ihe wardens has been 
the insufficient number or entire 
lack ol Coast Guard-approved 
life vests for each person on 
board.
Stale law requires these CG- 

approved vests on all public 
water and persons 12 years of 
age and younger are required to 
wear Ihe C'G-approved vest at 
all times while underway.

Local lakes might have more 
restrictive rules concerning life 
vests and boaters are reminded 
to check the local regulations 
before putting afloat.

Boating regulations concerning 
proper equipment and safe op­
eration of your boat can be 
found in Ihe "Digest of the 
Texas Water Safety Act" avail­
able at most boat marinas, boat 
dealers and all I’&WD offices.

B O B  B U L L O C K  
Comptroller ol Public Accounts

DEAR MR BlJU.fX K
I was at the nursery 

recently and bought a pecan 
tree, a peach tree and some 
tomato plant seeds. The clerk 
charged sales lax on the trees, 
but not on the tomato seeds. 
Why?

The sales lax law requires 
that Iruil trees be taxed 
unless purchased hv commer­
cial orchard operators who 
arc in the business o f prudui 
inf’ food for human consump­
tion.

Tomato and other seeds

that produce fooiJ for human 
consumption are exempt 
from the sales lux

l‘lease note, however, 
seeds of flowermx and other 
/hunts used for beautification 
are sub/ect lo the tax.
DEAR HOB

I recently bought a used 
electric can opener and some 
clothing from a second-hand 
shop, and the clerk there 
charged me sales tax. I 
thought you had to pay the 
sales lax only on items pur­
chased new. Was I cheated'’

Vo. The clerk was correct 
in i haryiny you the tax. .Sales 
taxes arc based on the fa d  
that a sale was made the aye 
or condition of an item has 
no hcartnx on its taxability.

If you have a question, 
write Ask Bob Bullock, c/o 
Tax In fo rm a tio n , LBJ 
Building, Austin, Texas 
78774 or call toll-free 
1-800 252-5555.

Record trade 
blamed on weather

defic it

&H0r  rOtK  tn G 5 c
Each ol these advertised items is returned to be readily avail 

able lor sale al or below the advertised price in each store 
eicept as specifically noted m this ad

Pauly’s Slim Una

Cheese Slices
Mild or Muester. All American Brand

Cheese Blunts
Oanola Pork And

Pressed Ham

12-oz.
P k|

10-oa.
Pk|

4-01.
Pk|

All American Brand 
Individually Wrapped, Sliced

Pimento
Cheese 12-oz.

Pkg.

OWEN'S (2 lb.ROLL2.95)

1-Lb.
Roll

$ -|1 9

*149

Hoimel Can

Ham Patties
Beet or Meat

Rath Bologna
Fanner Jones, Cry-0-Vac Smoked

Sliced Bacon
"Mix or Match”

Plains, Prices, Bell

Sour Cream 
Party Dips

3 K: $1

Sausage
Skinned & Deveined, Sliced

Beef 
Liver
Swift's 16 Lbs. And Up

Butterball CQC 
Turkey -  Du

Lb. 69*

32-oz., 6 Btl. Ctn. Arrow REGULAR 79c

Coca Charcoal Frito-Lay
Cola Briquets Chips

$139 Q Q ( AQC
i Ctn. S

Plus Deposit * 4 9
Plain Wolfs— .  . . .  d k p *  Borden s Brand

Chili ,sCan 6 5 c Eagle Milk
125-Ct., 2 Pty Delta Pape, Van cSp'a

Towels 2 89c Tuna
14-01.

Can

6'i-or
Can

Dl,le E,,» D*» 9-oz Cold C 4 C Q

/ « r  Cups "2 i
U p b A  Heinz. Hot Dog or Sweet

6 5 c Relish - 59e

P'lfiy W'ub

Low Fat Milk
P I A U S  CHOCOLATE

MILK
Bluebonnet, Regular Quarters

Oleo

Gal
Ctn

S I  33

o r . 4 7 t
16 o r  

Pkg 5 9 *
Chocolate Best Maid Hamburger. Whole or Polish Borden's Nabisco Assorted Flavors Aluminum. Standard Roll

Hershey Dill Orange Snack Reynolds
Syrup Pickles Drink Crackers Foil

*& 4 y 8 9 ° 5 9 ° ■a 6 9 C 3  *1Rolls |

\
*

t
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Th e
C o nsum er
A le rt

f k
by John L Hill Attorney General

_____________
AUSTIN—If you haven't 

bought a product that comes 
with a warranty lately, you 
may be surprised at how that 
warranty has changed The 
Federal Trade Commission 
has recently put into effect 
ce rta in  ru les assu ring  
compliance with the Mag 
nuson-Moss Warranty Act 
passed by Congress in 1975.

It’s important to realize, 
though, say our Consumer

Protection Division attorneys, 
that these changes won’t 
e lim in a te  all p o ten tia l 
warranty problems. For one 
thing, they note, neither the 
FTC rules nor the Warranty 
Act require manufacturers to 
give warranties or guarantees 
(which are the same thing). 
For another, they only cover 
w ritte n  w a rra n tie s  on 
products costing more than 
$15.

But consumers still have

protection under the implied 
warranty that comes with 
every product guaranteeing 
that it will do the jol) it was 
intended to do. As an example, 
a consumer whose new 
microwave oven doesn’t cook 
would be covered by this 
implied warranty.

What the new warranty 
rules do is make warranty tags 
easier to read and understand, 
so consumers will know what 
coverage they have. Now. 
written warranties must be 
available for consumers to 
read before they buy an item. 
Sometimes in the past, 
w a r ra n tie s  and o th e r  
information were enclosed in 
plastic or got lost, making it 
impossible for a consumer to 
comparison shop for warranty 
coverage before a purchase. 
Warranties must now be easy 
to read and understand. In 
other words, legal jargon and 
fine print will be eliminated.

All warranty conditions

must be in writing. Promises 
given by a salesperson are not 
valid In addition, written 
warranties fall into two 
categories—full and limited. 
The differences sometimes are 
confusing.

Full warranties provide the 
following: Defective products 
will be fixed at no cost, 
including picking up the 
pnxluct and re-installing it 
later. A pnxluct that cannot be 
fixed will be replaced or its 
purchase price refunded.

Product repairs must be 
done within a reasonable lime, 
and consumers won't have to 
take any unreasonable actions 
to get their warranty service. 
Our attorneys point out. 
however, that the rules don't 
p rec ise ly  d e fin e  w hat 
"reasonable” and “unreason­
able” mean, but that the FTC 
has said that having to return 
a piano to a factory for service 
would be "unreasonable.”

Full warranties cover the

pnxluct during the entire 
warranty |x>riod no matter 
how many limes it may change 
hands. But a full warranty
may not cover the entire 
pnxluct. On an air condition­
er, it might cover only the 
compressor, for example. 
Other [tarts, though, may 
carry limited warranties. It’s 
ini|xirlanl for the consumer to 
be fully aware, in such cases, 
what coverage the two 
combined warranties on the 
product may give.

Limited warranties also 
cover repair and parts 
replacement, although they do 
not offer theexlent of coverage 
of a full warranty. A limited 
warranty on a toaster, for 
example, might cover parts 
and not labor and might 
require you to take the toaster 
back to the same store where 
you bought it for service

If you have a consumer 
com plain t involving a 
warranty problem, get in

touch with the Attorney 
General's (Consumer Protec­
tion Division in Austin. 
Houston. Dallas. San Antonio, 
l.ublxx-k, HI Paso,or McAllen. 
Outside those areas, call this 
toll-free number: 1-800- 
2M-92.W.

•  *  •  •
The finest sermons are 

seen , not h ea rd ; they 
live in the lives of men
and women.

* * * *
About the only net re­

sult of emotionalism is 
that the speaker perspires 
freely.

*  *  *  •

Happiness is in part 
the conclusion that you 
can’t remake people or 
the world.

*  • *  *

W e’re a little suspi­
cious of the man who is 
a lw a y s  im m a c u la te ly  
groomed.

Definition
Sofa: A long, upliol- 

s le rc d  seal on which 
children may recline at 
lull length and wipe their 
dirty feet.

Banner, Akrqn.

The United States is a 
marvelous country--every 
state has the best climate. 

* * * ♦
Our experience is that 

time, when allowed to 
work, will solve many 
problems.

^ Doable Crop, 
Soaflowors Behind Wheat

JOHN F. HERZER A ASSOCIATES 
Arc now offering a "PLANT NOW-PAY LATER” program on top 

quality hybrid sunflower seed. There is no interest or carrying 
charges. You pay for your planting seed when you harvest your 
crop. The "JOINT-VENTURE" contract being offered gives the 
grower an $. 11 per pound guaranteed based price, plus a 50 percent 
share of any increase in the market that might develop at harvest 
time. For the grower who does not wish to contract, the top quality 
hybrid seed are priced to sell at competitive prices. For the best deal 
on planting seed, sunflower contracts or the open market contact 
the local dealer in your area representing the "Sunflower People of 
West Texas.”

Glen W atkins, Denier 
925-6743

Morton’s, Frozen

Romaine, 
Red or Green Golden

Ida Tragi french Fried

Frozen Potatoes / S r
Trophy Sliced, Frozen

Strawberries 2 s  -
Pi|gty Wiggly, Frozen

Garden Fresh

Salad Dressing, Kraft's Kraft's

Ray-O-Vac General Purpose. C or D 
Size 1.5 Volt, Pkg. of Two (2)

Disposable Butane
On First Purchase. Thereafter Regular Price. On First Two Bottlts. Thereafter Regular

Price.

For Color Prints. 110 or 
126 Size. 12 Exposures

Frozen

Overnight Diapers

Assorted Flavors. Royal
ISO-Ct.

TH IS W E E K 'S  
FEATU RED  ITEM

SA LA D
FO RKWitt) this coupon when you 

buy one ( 1 )  1 0 -o z. Jar
Whole PeeledButtermilk or Sweetmilk

( H t l t l S f  I l f  Ml M 
MMINI I A N D  OH 

V A | M AI I A 
I ’A I f t  |<N

Coupon expires 
July 2. 1977.

Onions 1 tm  b u .

Red, Ripe

Cherry
Tomatoes 69Basket

Crisp

Fresh 4 
Radishes i 39

»

Piggly Wiggly, Hot Dog Or White. 9 Inch Piggly Wiggly Tea Liquid Cleaner

Hamburger Paper Tomato Instant Pine-Sol
Buns Plates Catsup Nestea Disinfectant

3 * * 1 'x .  8 y * 6 ? * 1 4 9 . . .  * 1 * 9
Btl |

I v4
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Researchers Look At New Production Methods
Wiih the prospect of new taxes 

on energy, growers will be 
looking for ways to farm with 
less fuel.
Recent research on limited 

tillage in the Great Plains will 
help solve the problem. These 
conclusions were reached by 
Ron Allen and Dr. Bill Fryrcar, 
Agricultural Engineers at USDA 
Research Centers at Bushland 
and Big Spring. Texas. They 
reported these findings at a 
recent meeting of The American 
Society of Agricultural Engi­
neers held at Raleigh. North 
Carolina. June 26-29.
The two Engineers with the 

Agricultural Research Service

say that conservation tillage 
research has been underway in 
the Southern Great Plains since 
1942. In that landmark year a 
sweep plow was built and tested 
at the Bushland Center. Back 
then scientists at Bushland were 
looking for ways to control wind 
erosion. Their machine not only 
controlled wind and water ero­
sion but conserved soil moisture 
and increased yield. Since the 
advent of the sweep plow many 
other limited tillage practices 
that conserve water have been 
developed in the Great Plains. 
Recent experiments with tractor 
power requirements show that 
fuel conservation is an added

benefit for limited tillage sys­
tems.
The scientists point out that 

efficient agricultural production 
will not solve the national 
energy crisis because farmers 
only use three to four percent of 
the nation's energy budget to 
produce food and haul it to 
market. From the growers' 
standpoint conserving fuel will 
help keep farming profitable in 
an era of constantly rising 
energy prices.

"Limited tillage will definitely 
help control wind and water 
erosion," the scientists pointed 
out. They found examples of 
research that prove this in the

Great Plains as lar north as 
Madison. South Dakota, where 
investigators conducted exper­
iments on a 5.8 percent slope. 
They compared the moldboard 
plow, sweeps and disk as me­
thods of seedbed preparation for 
corn. Disking and planting were 
combined into one operation. 
Soil loss from water erosion was 
six tons per acre where mold- 
board plowing was used. This 
was reduced to 3.5 tons per 
acre with sweeps and the 
disk-till plant system. It took 13 
gallons of fuel per acre to till 
and plant corn when a mold- 
board plow was used. Sweep 
tillage was more efficient and

WOULD YOU BELIEVE

for a reliable
LOCKWOOD

Center Pivot* at

MID PLAINS
IRRKSAUON

Better believe it! In plain words, we want your business. So, we’re 
offering brand new Lockwood Center Pivot Irrigation Systems at 
some pretty hard-to-believe prices. And that’s not a ll...

...we’re leasing for less!
Here's proof: One of our new plans calls for just a 10% security 
deposit -  which you get back later with interest, and no payment 
due lo r 18 months! Or choose from several other great lease plans. 
Read on.

...and giving fast delivery!
How fast? We’ll put a new Lockwood on your farm just days after 
finalization of purchase. That fast.

Hard to believe! But it’s all true, every word.
As we said, we want your business.

•Lockwood S-Towor Model 2286 Electric Drive F O B. G ering, N ebraska

A U T H O R IZ E D  S A LE S  A N D  S E R V IC E

L O C K W O O D
Pivot Irrigation Systems

Mid Plains 
Irrigation Inc.

Hwy. 70 M uleskoe, Texas 2 7 2 -4 0 0 0

reduced fuel required Id nine 
gallons per acre. Disking and 
plaining in one operation reduc­
ed fuel needs to seven gallons 
per acre. Corn yields were 4,000 
pounds per acre wiih the two 
efficient systems and only 3,700 
pounds per acre with moldboard 
plowing.
Scientists at Alliance, Nebras­

ka. had a similar experience 
producing wheal in a wheat- 
fallow sequence. Soil loss dur­
ing the fallow year was 6.5 tons 
per acre with moldboard plow­
ing. Soil loss between wheal 
crops dropped to three tons per 
acre with oneway plowing and 
two Ions per acre with sweeps. 
Moldboard plowing after wheat 
harvest required 50 pereenl 
more fuel than tillage with 
sweeps or a oneway plow.
"Further south in the Great 

Plains, controlling wind erosion 
is a big conservation 
challenge.” the scientists stat­
ed. At Bushland. Texas, sweep 
plowing leaves more residue on 
the soil surface and gives better 
wind erosion control than one­
way plowing. The two plowing 
methods have been compared in 
a wheal-fallow cropping se­
quence since 1942. In addition 
to decreasing erosion, soil 
moisture storage during the 
fallow was increased 1.5 inches 
per year by sweep tillage. This 
extra soil moisture increased 
wheal yield 13 percent or 1.3 
bushels per acre. "Over the 
long haul, that makes a lot of 
difference in the potential for 
profit." Engineer Allen pointed 
out.

In a recent experiment at 
Bushland, Jack Musick and Dr. 
Allen Wiese used herbicides to 
replace disking during fallow 
periods in irrigated wheat-sor­
ghum fallow cropping se­
quence. Weeds were controlled 
with AAtrex and 2,4-D from 
wheal harvest to sorghum plant­
ing. This new procedure 
increased soil moisture storage 
1.5 inches during the 11-month 
fallow over disk tillage. Grain 
sorghum yields after the fallow 
were increased 900 pounds per 
acre in the 3-year study. Fuel 
needed to control weeds be­
tween the crops was cut from 18 
to five gallons per acre when 
herbicides were substituted for 
tillage. This included fuel used 
to manufacture herbicides. Sim­
ilar results were obtained by Dr. 
Paul Linger at Bushland when 
dryland sorghum was grown on 
chemically fallowed land after 
harvest of irrigated wheat.
In Hays, Kansas, no-tillage 

was evaluated in a dryland 
wheat-sorghum-fallow cropping 
sequence. After the study had

n

% n
f r

RIBBON CUTTING MONDAY. ..Monday morning, dignitaries from the Muleshoe Chamber of Commerce 
and Agriculture were on hand for Mayor Ken Henry to perform ribbon-cutting ceremonies for Lee’s 
Western Wear, who had a grand opening Monday. Pictured from left are Tommy Black. Howard Watson. 
Harvey Bass, the Dunbar family, Ken Henry. Dani Dunham and Pat Shafer.

progressed several years, atra- 
zinc did not control certain grass 
weeds. The problem was solved 
bv sweep plowing once after 
wheat harvest and again before 
sorghum planting. This system 
saved 1.5 gallons of fuel com­
pared to sweep tillage during 
the entire fallow. The big bene­
fit was increasing sorghum yield 
an average of 1,000 pounds per 
acre during the 5-year study.

"Double-cropping sorghum 
after irrigated wheat harvest is 
another cropping sequence 
where no-lillagc does a good 
job." Allen stated. In addition 
to saving a lot of time and fuel, 
grain sorghum yields were in­
creased 500 pounds per acre. 
Sorghum was planted immed­
iately after wheat harvest about 
one inch deep with a grain drill.

Furrow irrigation supplied wa­
ter to germinate sorghum and 
volunteer wheat. Volunteer and

Which?
Several times in life 

man faces the difficult 
problem of trying to de­
cide which will cost less: 
To tell the truth or hire a 
lawyer.

-Post, Washington, D.C.

weeds were controlled with 
AAtrex when sorghum was six 
inches tall.
Allen summarized his presen­

tation by stating that past 
research in the Great Plains will 
help farmers reduce fuel con­
sumption. "In cropping systems 
where limited or no-tillage is 
feasible, wind and water erosion 
are controlled, and fuel savings 
frequently exceed 50 percent," 
Allen concluded.

P R EA C H ER  S E Z  Hg 
A l N V  P V S W ltf'U T E  
IN S U R A N C E AS MUCH 
A S  F I R E  iHSyRAHCE.
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Good Prices On
Tooy Laaa Boots
Sodgofiold, Levi 

lWraoglor Jeans

Also
Work Boots 
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Bitter Cucumber 
Explanation Vague
Every year about this time a 

seemingly serious problem oc­
curs in home gardens in nearly 
all oarts of Texas-bitter cucum­
bers and oftentimes bitter egg­
plants.
Sam Cotner. vegetable special­

ist with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, says that 
explanations for the bitter fruits 
range from old wives tales to 
seemingly accurate scientific ex­
planations. Commonly heard 
causes include planting by the 
wrong sign of the moon, har­
vesting after noon, improper 
watering and fertilization, and 
high temperatures during fruit 
growth and development.

What is the real reason for this 
phenomenon?
"It is St'fe to say that the exact 

cause is unknown even though 
numerous tests have been con­
ducted to investigate this pro­
blem," points out Cotner. 
Research has determined that 
bitterness is genetic and there­
fore can be inherited. This 
simply means that some 
varieties can be more bitter than 
others, but does not explain how 
differences within a variety can 
exist, or how bitterness can vary 
from fruit to fruit on the same 
plant. Such differences tend to 
indicate that bitterness is affect­
ed and controlled by other 
conditions.

"It appears that any conditions 
that place the plant in stress can 
lead to bitter fruit," explains 
the Texas A&M University Sys­
tem specialist. "Without a 
doubt, in Texas these conditions 
are low moisture, high tempera­
ture and low fertility. Any one of 
these conditions by itself may 
cause the problem, but gener­

ally it's a combination of more 
than one of these factors. 

"Reports of bitter fruit gener­
ally occur in Texas during June, 
July and August but seldom 
early in the spring or late in the 
fall," says Cotner. "Young, 
vigorous growing plants seldom 
produce bitter fruit. Conditions 
early in the year are generally 
favorable for good growth, but 
as the season progresses, high 
temperature, moisture stress 
and perhaps low fertility condi­
tions occur."
To help prevent bitter fruit, 

Cotner recommends that gar­
deners should try to maintain 
favorable growing conditions 
during the hot summer months, 
realizing that in some areas of 
Texas it is almost impossible to 
raise some crops during the heat 
of midsummer. Periodically ap­
ply light applications of fertilizer 
around cucumbers and egg­
plants to maintain their vigorous 
growth. Mulching will also help 
to reduce water loss. Water 
more often as the temperature 
increases toward midsummer. 
"In spite of the proper care 

and attention given to cucum­
bers and eggplants even when 
growing conditions are favor­
able, bitterness can still occur," 
notes Cotner. “ If this happens, 
home gardeners should peel 
their eggplants and cucumbers 
a little deeper as bitterness is 
generally associated with the 
skin."
An interesting fact, notes the 

specialist, is that on cucumbers, 
the stem end is always more 
bitter than the blossom end.

Amin wants U.S. to reopen 
embassy.

Sat. July 2
STUDENT

W ra n g le r i.................................$6
M ENS L O N G  SLEEVE

Sport Shirts........................ $3.98
BOYS L O N G  SLEEVE 8-18

Sport Shirts........................ $2 .50
M EN S & BOYS SHORT SLEEVE

Shirts....................................... 2 /$ 5
LADIES

Short Sots & Dresses.... $2 .98
LADIES

Blovses & Tank Tops.... $2.98
GIRLS

Hand Bogs................................$1
BOYS

Tennis Shoes......................5 1 .9 8
& Many More Items
The Fair Store

120 Main  2 7 2 - 3 6 0 0

TEENS ATTEND 4-H LEADER LAB...Young leaders from Bailey County 4-H clubs attended and
participated in the District Two 4-H Leader lab last week. Site of the three-day summer workshop was 
South Plains College, Levelland. Attending from Bailey County were from left, standing, Belinda 
Wheeler. Delia Shaw, Kristi Henry and Jacinda Gleason and front row, from left, Johnny Puckett, Kelly 
Harrison and Jimmy Gleason.

Enochs News
By Mrs. J.D. Bay  fa s t

Mrs A.P. Fred spent Saturday 
night with her sister, Earlene
Llogsion at Levelland.

. . . . .
Visiting in the home of Mr. and 

Mrs Dean Waltrip is his sister, 
Mr and Mrs. Rusty Dcspaine 
from Parker. Ariz., his dad, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Waltrip from 
Amalillo.

Mr. and Mrs. Orphas Tate and 
children of Cotton Center and 
Mr and Mrs. Junior Austin and 
sons of Lubbock visited their 
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Austin father's day weekend 
and Greg stayed to spend the 
week with his grandparents. 

. . . . .
Guests last Sunday in the home 

ol Mr. and Mrs. Chester Petree 
were her sisters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Nat Hill and Mr. and Mrs. 
Charlie Williamson of Lubbock.

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Coffman 
of Mulcshoc accompanied by 
Mrs. J.D. Bayless drove to 
Lubbock Wednesday afternoon 
to visit their brother, Clyde 
( oflnun at Highland hospital in 
Lubbock.

Autry are spending some time 
with their father, John Autry at
McAllen.

.  • •  .  .
Mr and Mrs. Claude Brown of 

Ropcsvillc visited in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Chester Petree 
Sunday evening.

Mr and Mrs. G.O. Smith are 
home from a two weeks vacation 
to Fort Worth, Irving, Forney, 
Sherman and Bull Shoalcs Lake 
in Ark.

visit with them

T i t
Sandhills

Philosopher
Editor's note: The Sandhills 

Philosopher on his Johnson 
grass farm on Sandy Creek 
examines a theory on crime this 
week. We guess he's serious, 
but you never know .
Dear editor:
According loan article I read in 

a magazine last night because 
there wasn’t anything to watch 
except re-runs, some experts 
have come out with a theory on 
why people go bad. They say it’s 
something they ate.

According to them child delin­
quency . which leads to adult 
delinquency, which leads to 
crime, which leads to jail or 
would if the cops could catch 
them and if the courts would 
ever get around to trying them 
and some lawyer didn't get 
them off and if he doesn’t and 
they go to jail they weren't let 
out soon to start robbing all over

again- anyway, to get hold of 
this sentence before it arm- 
wrestles me to the ground, 
according to them child delin­
quency is caused by inadequate 
or improper diet. Kids either 
don't get enough protein-rich 
food or they cat too much junk 
food.
In many cases this is probably 

true, but the trouble with 
theories is that if you keep 
reading you’ll run into some­
thing else that makes you 
scratch your head.

For instance, when former 
Attorney General John Mitchell 
went to prison (he other day. the 
newspapers reported that he 
was the 25th member of the 
Watergate group to be jailed. 
This got me to thinking. What 

did those 25 men eat when they 
were kids?

Like the rest of the nation, I 
saw all of them on television and 
they all looked like they'd had a 
well-fed childhood, and were all 
eating good at the time they 
were caught. Not a one looked 
like he'd ever been under-nour­
ished.

Sidewalk Sale
July  2

Buy A Dozen Spudnuts 
For Only

*140

328 M a il

SpudnutShop
272-3542

G O O D ?  Y E A R

'AMERICAN EAGLE'RADIAL 
4th TIRE FREE
Save $551b $95 

Set Of 4
This is the new Goodyear radial you've seen on 
TV. With full width belts ol Flexten -  the tire 
cord denved from aramid liber that's pound lor 
pound stronger than steel. Strong enough for 
every road in America. Only From Goodyear

SALE ENDS JULY 9

MM'zAA7 ^ 1
WNltweH

SIM
Regular

Price
EACH

Regular 
Price 

3 TIRES
4th Tire 
FREE

Plua F.I.T . 
per tire. No 

trade needed

165SR-13 S 55.65 8166 95 FREE $180
165SR-15 S 58.85 $176.55 FREE $203

BR78-13 $ 69.30 $207 90 FREE $2.00
DR78-14 $ 75,90 $227.70 FREE $227
FR78-14 S 83.40 $250 20 FREE $2 54
GR78-14 $ 86 95 $260 85 FREE $269
GR78 15 S 89 25 $267 75 FREE $2 79
HR 78 14 $ 93 60 $280 80 FREE $288
HR78-15 S 95 85 $287 55 '| FREE $2.96

RAIN CHECK -  II we sell out ol your size we will issue you e 
rein check, assuring luture delivery at the advertised price

James Crane Tire Co.

It's pretty hard for me to 
believe you can blame Water 
gate on sodawatcr and potato 
chips.

Yours faithfully.
I A

M r and Mrs. Gene Autry and 
sons of Dimmitt visited Mr. 
John Autry last weekend, 

e e e e e

Mai he lie. Kin and Russell

Rev. and Mrs. J.J. Terry of 
Bovina visited in the home of 
L.G. Harris Sunday afternoon, 
and he preached at the Baptist 
Church Sunday night.

e e e e e

Rev. and Mrs. Charlie Shaw 
drove to Post Sunday after the 
morning services. He preached 
the ordination services of their 
son Danny Shaw at the Trinity 
Baptist Church at Post. They 
also spent the night with their 
son and family.

*  •  •  •  *

Mr. and Mrs. George Autry 
and family of Pep, N .M ., visited 
relatives in Enochs Sunday.

• • * * •
Mr and Mrs. W.B Peterson 

returned home Monday from a 
visit with their children, Mr. 
and Mrs. Morris Peterson and 
family at Hillsboro and Rev. and 
Mrs Harold Abney at Bynum 
and their grand children. Scott 
and Stephanie Peterson came 
home with them for a visit. 
Koby Abney came Sunday to

Mr. and Mrs. EX. Mliaro 
visited a granddaughter, Mr 
and Mrs. Buck Beech at Little
field last Sunday

a a a a a

Mr. and Mrs Bill Layton and 
son. John and daughter, An 
gelia from Pincvillc, Ore cam* 
Friday lor a visit with Mr and 
Mrs. J.W. Layton and other 
relatives. He is a nephew of the 
Laytons.

Mr and Mrs. Dean Gilliam 
and son of Morton visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. E.f 
Gilliam last Sunday night Mr 
and Mrs Wayne Gilliam and 
Rodona of Morton visited them
Sunday night.

• • * • •

Visitors at the Baptist Church 
Sunday were Mr and Mrs Bill 
Layton and family from Ore., 
Mrs. W.M. Bryant of Littlefield. 
Sandra Bryant of Clayton 
N.M.. Scott and Stephanie Pc 
terson of Hillsboro and Koby of 
Bynum.

*** * *
Mrs. Flo Nichols received word 

that her son. Sammie Nichols, 
has accepted the call as music 
and youth director at the Baptist 
Church at Henrietta, Okla.

Reading books isn 't al­
ways a short cut to cul­
tu re ; it d ep e n d s  upon 
what vou read.

Texas High In Cotton
The 1977 Texas < ofion i rop is 

off to a good start With good 
market conditions, farmers have 
planted fence row to ft-me rriw, 
and this year's crop could yield 
well over four million bales
Barring weather and insect 

problems, the Texas cotton crop 
has the potential of surpassing 
the 1973 crop of 4.6 million 
bales,
Thai analysis comes from 

Charles Baker, marketing spe- 
eialisl with the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service.

“ Furthermore, prices should 
be good," says Baker, "because 
we have a w orld w ide shortage of 
cotton. World stocks at the

beginning of the August I crop 
year have averaged 40 per cent 
of world consumption the past 
10 years. Beginning stocks on 
August I. 1977 will be a low 30 
per cent of projected consump­
tion. Low world stock levels in 
1972 and 1973 preceded the 
sharp price rise of 1973. Low 
stock levels in 1976 were ac­
companied by price increases 
for the 1976 crop. Yet, those 
levels for 1972, '73 and '76 were 
not nearly as low as current 
levels.

"Prices have been down for 
the last month because of the 
expected big crop for 1977," 
notes Baker.
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Service Stations Keep Tires 'Up’
"Once 1 could depend pn the 

corner service station to check 
my wife's car." a businessman 
complained to a friend recently. 
"Now, she saves money at a 
self-service station and is pro­
bably driving a time bomb with 
bad tires and no oil."

With the increasing popularity 
of self-service gasoline stations, 
the Tire Industry Safety Council 
advises motorists to seek out 
those stations with air pressure 
towers in order to keep their 
tires properly inflated.
The American Petroleum Insti­

tute reports that of the 189,000 
service stations in operation in 
1976, more than 68,000 of them 
offered some form of self ser­
vice. Of that number, more than
25.000 were total self-service 
stations and approximately
43.000 were split island sta­
tions, offering both self-service 
and full, attended-service, but 
at separate pump islands.

"Correct tire pressure is nec­
essary for safe driving, good tire 
mileage and responsive steer­

ing," according to Council 
Chairman Malcolm R. Lovell, 
Jr. "Industry experts say pro­
perly inflated tires can add five 
percent to gasoline mileage, or 
an extra mile per gallon, be­
cause they roll easier."

Proper tire inflation is one of 
the most neglected aspects of 
maintenance and care related to 
passenger automobiles in the 
United States." according to a 
report by the Sub-Council on 
Product Safety of the National 
Business Council for Consumer 
Affairs. "The consequences of 
this neglect are serious to the 
American consumer in many 
respects," the Sub-Council 
held.
Government studies have 

found that underinflation by 
four to 12 pounds can reduce 
tread life by 10 to 40 percent and 
that more than one out of four 
cars has at least one seriously 
underinflated tire. Overinfla­
tion, on the other hand, causes 
excessive tread wear to the 
center of the tread, and causes

tires to run hard and makes 
them vulnerable to impact dam­
age.
Regarding the dwindling num­

ber of air towers at service 
stations, an official of the Amer­
ican Automobile Association re­
marked, "We have said it's 
going to be an increasing pro­
blem as the trend goes to ‘gas 
and go'. We advise motorists to 
make each third fillup at a 
full-service station."
J.K. Aldous, managing direc­

tor of AAA's Public Affairs 
Division, added, "We also en­
courage people to use an accu­
rate hand tire gauge because 
service station air pumps are

very rarely accurate. The reason 
for making every third fillup at a 
full-service station is so a 
motorist may have his tires, oil, 
battery, window washer wells, 
wiper blades and lights checked 
in order to prevent damage to 
the car and insure longer car life 
and carefree driving."

"Air pressure should be check­
ed when tires arc cold every two 
or three weeks and before long 
trips." Lovell said. “The best 
time is in the morning when you 
have driven less than a mile."
Lovell said that some air 

escapes from all tires over aw 
period of weeks. A tire with four 
or more pounds of pressure

Texas Cattleman Registered

Universal Treating 
Co.r Inc.

Water Well 
Acidizing

No Job Too Small 
Or Too Large

Cad Coded
Universal Treating 

Co., Inc.
Lovolland, Texas 
806-894-6125

Registration figures in the 
nation's first Beef Referendum 
are in and it appears that over 
42,000 cattlemen registered in 
Texas. In the U.S., over 295,000 
producers have registered. 
These figures were released 
today by the Texas Beef Devel­
opment Taskforce (BDT).

"W e're extremely pleased 
with the interest and turnout," 
says J.D. Sartwelle, a rancher 
from Sealy and chairman of the 
Texas BDT. "More than 1,000 
cattlemen on the Texas BDT 
have worked to inform cattle­
men about the merits of the 
program and pushed for a high 
registration." says the rancher. 
“ This dedicated work and wide­
spread news coverage by the 
Texas media are responsible for 
the large registration turnout," 
he adds.
Only cattlemen who registered 

during the June 6-17 sign-up at 
their local ASCS office are 
qualified to vote July 5-15.

"With the passage of the Beef 
Referendum, the cattle industry 
will have means of stabilizing 
our industry and increasing 
profits for cattlemen," Sart­
welle says. He points out that 
the Beef Referendum, if approv­
ed by two-thirds of the produc­
ers voting next month, would 
raise an estimated $30 million to 
$40 million annually. This 
money would be used for beef 
research, education, promotion 
and foreign market 'develop­
ment.
Cattle producers would assess

themselves 3/10 of one percent 
(30 cents per $100 value) for 
each animal they sell. The 
money would be "passed 
through” at the point of each 
sale, but money would be 
remitted only at the time the 
animal is slaughtered. The 
funds would be sent to a 
national Beef Board, adminis­
tered by 68 cattle producers 
from the major cattle producing 
states.
“The 68 producers will be 

nominated by cattle organiza­
tions in each state. The nomin­
ees will be selected from these 
associations either by a mem­
bership election or through ap­
pointment by the directors of 
each group,” Sartwelle points 
out. The Secretary of Agricul­
ture will confirm the appointees 
and assure that the funds are 
properly invested in accordance 
with the law, he adds.

“ In order for the Referendum 
to be valid at least 50 percent of 
those who registered must rer . 
turn to their ASCS office and 
vote. Then, at least two-thirds of 
those voting must vote 'Yes' 
before the program will be put 
into effect," the BDT chairman 
says.

"This may be the last oppor­
tunity that producers have to 
vote on a self-help program," 
concludes Sartwell. "So we urge 
every producer who registered 
to return and vote 'Yes’ for a 
more profitable beef industry."

below the amount recommend­
ed by the vehicle manufacturer 
in the owner's manual is consid­
ered seriously undcrinflaled, he 
pointed out. Undcrinflalion by 
four pounds can cut tread life by 
10 percent, he continued.
"The proper amount of free air 

is the cheapest service you can 
give a tire, and it will do the 
utmost toward extending its 
useful life while saving gasoline 
at the same time," Lovell said. 

American motorists could save 
at least 800 million gallons of 
gasoline a year if they would 
only inflate their tires properly, 
he concluded.

Six FIagsPlans 
Country Concert 
This Weekend

Six Flags Over Texas has 
scheduled two concerts by 
singer-songwriter Don Williams 
on Saturday, July 2.

Williams popularity as a coun­
try singer has been increasing in 
the United States as well as 
England where he was voted the 
Country Music Entertainer of 
the Year for 1976.
His latest album, "Visions,” 

had already sold a million copies 
in England before the official 
release date and is doing well in 
the United States.
Williams has penned some 500 

songs for himself and other 
entertainers. The top hits in­
clude "Amanda,” "Come Early 
Morning," “ The Shelter Of 
Your Eyes," "Till The Rivers 
Run Dry” and "You're My Best 
Friend.”
While living in Corpus Christi, 

Williams formed the Pozo Seco 
singers group and recorded his 
own pop-folk song, "Time." 

After the group broke up, 
Williams continued to write and 
began performing the country 
and western music that he has 
stayed with ever since.
Concerts are scheduled at 8 

and 10 p.m. in the theme park's 
Music Mill Theater.
Six Flags Over Texas will be 

open from 10 a.m. to midnight 
on Saturday, July 2.

Correct
One thing in which the 

sexes are equal is in think­
ing that they’re not.

-Quote Magazine.
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Styled For

SUNTIME

Many stylish summery looks. Multi-pocket 
compartments. Adjustable shoulder strap 
or top handles. Whites, Bones and Straws.

Men’s Knit Slits

Corefree, comfortable fabric 
blends in sizes S-M -L-XL. 
Short sleeve knit ond cut 
ond sewn shirts in distinctive 
solid colors ond good-look­
ing patterns.

Select Group 
Of Men’s Slacks

v.i*~ |  **97
Te $20 \ £  .

^Available in fancies and 
solids, in a variety of 

summer shades Sires 29-42.

Beautiful 100% cotton terry towels in 
stripes, jacquards, prints and coordinating 
solids Sizes 22"x42" and 22"x44". Slight 
imperfects
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AUSTIN -  Rep. Frank 
Hartung, backed by House 
Speaker Bill Clayton, ha* 
made a bid to have hia atate 
money management bill re­
vived on the agenda for the 
forthcoming apecial legists 
tive aeaaion.

The Houaton Republican 
told a news conference thia 
week he and Clayton have 
both written Gov. Dolph 
Briscoe asking that HB 1984 
be included on the agenda of 
the session now scheduled 
to begin July 11.

HB 1984, which died in a 
Senate committee during 
the last days of the regular 
session, requires the State 
Treasury and Depository 
Board to invest more of the 
state’s money in interest­
paying time deposits.

It would also grant the 
state agency new power to 
invest in savings and loan 
accounts, as well as govern­
ment securities, authority 
the Treasury doesn’t have 
under present law.

Hartung said the state is 
currently losing $2 million 
monthly on money deposited 
in non-interest paying 
checking accounts scattered 
in more than 1,300 banks 
state-wide.

He said it was appropri­
ate his bill should be in­
cluded in the special session 
called to pass a public school 
finance bill for the next 
two years.

The approximately $42 
million lost every two years 
because of poor money man­
agement could be used to 
help finance public schools 
in Texas, he said.

Hartung admitted he 
hasn't had any indication 
from the governor that his 
bill is being considered as

a special session agenda 
item.

Also bidding for a spot in 
the session are bills to re­
peal the state sales tax on 
utilities and to reform the 
state property tax code.

So far, however, Briscoe 
had indicated only public 
school finance will be on the 
agenda and all other mat­
ters are merely under con­
sideration.

Water Agencies
The Texas Water Devel­

opment Board began last 
Monday the work of reor­
ganizing the present three 
state water agencies into 
one entity to be known as 
the Texas Water Resources 
Board.

The WltH is responsible 
for carrying out the reor­
ganisation under a new law 
passed by the fiftth legisla­
ture and effective Sept. 1. 
The Texas Water Quality 
Board, Water Development 
Board and Water Rights 
Commission are to be com­
bined.

All three of the current 
executive directors are vy­
ing openly for the job as 
head of the super agency 
including Hugh C. Yantia 
(WQB), Gen. James M. 
Rose (WDB) and Robert 
Schnieder (WRC).

However, WDB Chairman 
A. L. Black said after the 
first meeting the final 
choice might come from 
outside the present execu­
tive circle. "I wouldn't want 
to narrow the field down to 
any one, two or three in­
dividuals,’’ Black said.

Hill Will Sue
Atty. Gen. John Hill said 

this week he will take the 
Texas Water Rights Com­
mission to court if neces­
sary to overturn its latest 
order.

Last week the WRC 
okayed a $50 million, 65- 
year contract by which the 
Lower Colorado River Au­
thority will sell water to the 
South Texas Nuclear Proj­
ect at Bay City.

Hill maintains the water 
in the state’s rivers and 
impoundments belongs to 
the people and while river 
authorities have the right 
to control it, they have no 
right to sell it.

Reminded that several 
other river authorities in 
the state are selling water 
under similar contracts, Hill 
remarked “I’ve learned a lot 
from this case and we’ll be 
looking at some of these 
other contracts too.”

Appointments
Just before leaving on va­

cation, Gov. Briscoe handed 
out appointments to various 
state agencies and institu­
tions by the bunches.

These included three new 
members to the Texas 
Southern University Board 
of Regents, the Rev. Moses 
L. Price and Ronald Pruitt 
of Houston, Milledge A. 
Hart III of Dallas, and the 
reappointment of Ernest S. 
Sterling of Tyler.

Texas Tech University 
also got three new regents 
in Clint Formby of Here­
ford, Roy K. Furr of Lub­

bock and James L. Snyder 
of Baird.

James R. (Jim Bob) Pax­
ton of Palestine was ap­
pointed to a six year term 
on the Parks and Wildlife 
Commission replacing long­
time member Jack R. Stpne 
of Wells who is resigning

New Judgeship
Olin G. Wellborn 

Alvin is Briscoe’s choice for 
the bench of the newly 
created 239th Judicial Dis­
trict Court in Brazoria 
County.

Judge Wellborn is for­
merly judge of the 23rd 
Judicial District Court.

He said he will not be a 
candidate for election to the 
judgeship in 1P78, stating 
“my successor should be 
elected by the people."

AG Opinions
Atty. Gen. John Hill has 
held a sheriff may not make 
an arrest outside of his 
county for an offense even 
if it is committed in his 
presence or within hia view. 
He can only make a citi­
zen's arrest but not act in 
his official capacity as sher­
iff. Hill held.

In another opinion Hill 
held the state auditor should 
disclose information on 
charges involving state em­
ployees who received pay­
ment for non-reimbursable 
travel expenses.

“The public is entitled to 
certain factual information 
from the records prepared 
in connection with an 
audit," Hill said in an opin­
ion requested by State Au­
ditor George W. McNiel.

“Whether particular rec­
ords are excepted . . . must 
be determined on a case-by- 
case basis by examining 
them in the light of policies 
underlying that exception 
. . . circumstances might 
justify withholding of fac­
tual information,” Hill 
wrote.

Courts Speak
Fear of nuclear accident 

can be considered by juries 
in land condemnation cases 
involving nuclear power 
plants, the Supreme Court 
has held.

In another case, the court 
set a July 13 hearing on a 
$500,000 judgment against 
General Motors and in favor 
of a Houston man who was 
blinded when a window of 
his car shattered in an acci­
dent.

A lower court jury had 
awarded Curtis Lee Sim­
mons $1 million but a Court 
of Civil Appeals reduced it 
to hslf that amount. GM ap­
pealed the case to the high 
court saying the lower court 
ruling would set a precedent 
that probably would be used 
against auto manufacturers 
in every accident case in­
volving pre-1972 cars and 
injuries from flying glass.
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Conserve Moisture In Home Landscape

OPEN RATES
1st insertion, per word ■ $.09 
2nd and add., per word • $.06 

NATIONAL RATES
1st insertion, per word ■ $.11 
2nd and add., per word • $.07 
Minimum Charge - $.50 
CARD OF THANKS - $3.00 
Classified Display • $1.30 per 

column inch.
Double Rate for Blind Ads 
DEADLINE FOR INSERTION 
11:00 Tucaday for Thursday 
11:00 Friday for Sunday

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO CLASSIFY, REVISE OR 
REJECT ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR 
ANY ERROR AFTER AD HAS 
RUN ONCE

H e lp  W a n t e d

Drouth conditions in many 
areas mean homeowners and 
gardeners must decide how to 
best use irrigation water. Some­
times, certain plants may have 
to be sacrificed to save others, 
says Everett E. Jannc, land­
scape horticulturist with the

We need your listings. 
Some choice lots for sale. 

POOL REAL ESTATE 
272-4716

214 AMERICAN BLVD.

WANTED: Boy to throw papers 
in Lenau and Country Gub 
addition.
3-24s-tfp

Need operators at Main Street 
Beauty Shop. Call 272-3448. 
3-12t-tfc
.........................................
Eiperiencd line mechanic five 
day work week, other fringe 
benefits. Town and Country
Auto Muleshoe, Texas.
3-14s-tfc

5. APTS. FOR RENT

Trailer ipacea to rent. Water 
fnrnlabed. Own me ten. Apia. 
Kitchenettes. 272-4440.
5-19t-104tp

l: R i a l  Estate 1
FOR SALE: Bailey-Cochran co­
unty line. 365 A good grass. 
Fenced, windmill, and pond. 
Irr. well, plenty rain. SI35 per 
acre $18,000 down, balance 31 
years at six per cent. 806-927- 
5357.
8-22t-tfc

Wanted . . . Small acreage. 
E.E. HOLLAND 
REAL ESTATE 
113 W. Ave.D 

PHONE 272-3293 
DAY OR NIGHT 

8-17s-tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 
garage, completely carpeted, 
excellent location. Phone 
272-3424 after 3 p.m.
8-25s-tfc

TWO BEDROOM HOUSE FOR 
SALE. 1534 W. Ave. B. Call 
965-2755 OR 272-5561.
8-25s-tfc

RICHLAND HILLS 3 bedroom 
brick, 1 3/4 bath. Fenced back 
yard, storm cellar. Call Sue 
806-933-43%. Whitaker Real 
Estate.
8-26t-tfc

FOR SALE by owner: 2000 sq. 
ft. Brick home 3 large bedro­
oms, 3 baths, den, large formal 
living room, fire place, storm- 
celler. stockade fence, storage 
house, very good location. Two 
blocks from Richland Hills Sch­
ool. Priced to sell. Phone 272- 
3001 or 272-3976.
8-26s-8 tp

We want your listings.
Reid Real Estate 

Need to sell small acreage 
with 2 houses.

Reid Real Estate 
611 Main Phone 272-3142 

or call Lucille Harp 272-4693 
8-26s-tfc ____

9. AUTOMOBILES FOR SALE
***************t*****«**t*4f
FOR SALE: 1974 Ford pickup 4- 
wheel drive. Also B'W portable 
TV. Call after 6 p.m. 272-3249.
9- 26s-tfc

10 FARM EQUIP.

FOR SALE: Model 105 John 
Deere Combine, 20 ft. header, 
air conditioned cab. L.P. Gas, 
good condition. Phone 272-3424 
after 3 p.m.
10- 25s-tfc

FOR SALE: 500 gallon propane 
tank on 4-wheel chasis. Phone 
272-3424 after 3 p.m.
10-25s-tfc

FOR SALE: 2 50 HP Electric 
irrigation motors with switch 
panels and meter loop. Phone 
272-3424 after 3 p.m.
10-25s-tfc

FOR SALE: 1 HD 13'X17Vi’ 
wide steel truck flat bed. 4 inch 
H Beam, stringers and 
sills-deck plate floor. S125 Glen 
Cherry 219 Quincey after 6 p.m.
10- 26t-2tp

11. FOR SALE OR TRADE

FOR SALE: Corn fed locker 
b e e f , o r  whole. 230 lb.-250 lb. 
carcus. Cut, wrapped and fro­
zen. 83 cents lb. Call JEFF 
SMITH AT 965-2214, 965-2830 
or 272-4588.
11- 25-tfc

LATE 1973 MODEL D-22 
WINNEBAGO Indian. 18,000 
actual miles. Loaded. SPUR­
GEONS MOTOR MACHINE.
ll-26t-tfc

20’ TRAVEL TRAILER. Tandem 
wheels. Self contained. Gas or 
electric refrigerator. 647-2245 
Dlmmitt.
1 l-26s-tfc

Complete half bed, mattress 
and box springs. Phone 
272-4536. 
ll-25.-tfc

HOUSES FOR SALE 
BY OWNER

Beautiful brick home. 4 large 
bedrooms, 2 baths, large living- 
den, corner fireplace, formal 
dining room, small office, sun 
room, walk-in utility room, 2 car 
garage, floored attic storage. 
Newly redecorated, excellent 
location. Children's playhouse. 
272-3848.
8-16s-tfc
FOR SALE: 10 acres, 4 bed- 
•oom brick home. 30 fruit 
rees, large shop and storage 
wilding. 3'/i miles NW from 
Muleshoe.

Smallwood Real Estate 
116 E. Ave C 

Phone 272-4838 
^ mmmm— _ _ _

SALES, LOANS 
AND

APPRAISALS
In Bailey County 30 Years 

KREBBS 
REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C.

15 Mite*llan»6ut

WANTED: information to the 
where abouts of W.H. WES­
LEY HOUSTON Powers, age 
43. Family background; 
father, George, brothers, Tom 
Tex and others; sisters, Vir­
ginia, Connie, Mildred and 
others. His maternal grand­
parents were a native of this 
area. H.W.'s family moved 
near Tulsa, Okla in 1945 or 46. 
Send any information to: 

JERRY ABBOUD 
RT. 1, BOX 48 

SAND SPRINGS,
OKU. 74063 
918-245-7706 

l-25t-3tp

FOR SALE OR TRADE for a
house in Friona, 2 bedroom, 
bouse Call 272-3520.
8-26s-4lc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom house. 
406 Weal Second Call 272-4491 
after 5 p.m.
j U _______________

FOR SALE: 4 room house lo be 
moved. Call 272-4422.
8 26s2tc

PHILLIPS HOUSE OF MUSIC 
118 MAIN

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO
Pianos, organs, band instru­
ments, new and used. Profes­
sional repairs, sheet music, 
rentals, terms.

Phone:505-763-5041.
15-30s-tfc

PAINTING AND BUILDING
REPAIR. HOWARD GRIFFIN.
272-3838
l5-22t-9kp

WANTED:
965-2322.
15-23s-8tc

Custom farming.

HOME INSUUTION We sell 
and install blown-in loose fill 
cellulose insulation. A practical 
and effective method of adding 
on to your existing insulation to 
obtain maximum savings on 
your utility bills. We can book 
your order now before the 
coming fall rush. For more 
information, free inspection and 
estimate call:

BORDER INSUUTION 
481-9257

FARWELL, TEXAS
15-26t-6tc

$100 REWARD Offered for ar­
rest and conviction of anyone 
doing damage to paper stands. 
Muleshoe Publishing Co. 272- 
4536. 
llt-15-tfc

WORK WANTED: Yard work of 
any kind. Mowing, rototilling. 
edging and etc. Call 965-2903. 
Rick Carlson and Jerry Wheat.
!5-24s-8tc

FOR SALE: Registered St. Ber­
nard and Great Dane puppies 
$70 Registered Great Dane Mo­
ther $100. Call 965-2115 or 
%5-2658.
IS-2bs-4lc

REGISTERED FAMILY HOME
Will keep your children in my 
home. Have openings. 272- 
49S7, 218 CEDAR.
IS 211 ll.

Custom Designed 
and

Madc-To-Order 
RINGS-N-THINGS 

BY JEROLLY
918 E Hickory 

Phone 272-3163

Legal Notice
NOTICE OF SALE OF 

REAL ESTATE
Notice is hereby given that by 

virtue of a certain Order issued 
by the Honorable Commission­
er’s Court of Bailey County, 
Texas, on the 13 day of June, 
A.D. 1977, entered on its min­
utes in Vol 7, Page 123, appoint­
ing Glen Williams, Commission­
er to sell and dispose of the 
following real estate, to-wit:
A 0.1799 acre tract if land out 

of Section 33, Block Y, W. D. & 
F. W. Johnson Subdivision, 
Muleshoe, Bailey County, Tex­
as. being more particularly des­
cribed as follows, to-wit: 

BEGINNING at a point in the 
North Half (M/2) of Section 33 
from whence the Southeast 
corner of the Southeast Quarter 
(SE/4) of Section 33 bears South 
25 degrees 47 feet West a 
distance of 791.43 feet and 
South 64 degrees 13 feet East a 
distance of 2890.55 feet, and 
South 14.2 feet; THENCE North 

%a distance of 207.96 feet to a 
point for corner; THENCE 
South 54 degrees 53 feet East a 
distance of 91.67 feet to a point 
for corner;
THENCE South 25 degrees 47 

feet West a distance of 172.39 
feet to the place of beginning 
and containing 0.1799 acres of 
land, more or less.
The purchaser assumes and 

agrees to pay all taxes owing 
and unpaid to the City of 
Muleshoe. the Muleshoe Inde­
pendent School District and 
Bailey County, Texas. 
THEREFORE, Notice is here­

by given that on the 11 th day of 
July, A.D. 1977, at the Court­
house door of Bailey County, 
Texas, in the City of Muleshoe, 
Texas, at 10:00 A.M. by virtue 
of said Order, 1 will for and in 
behalf of said Bailey County, 
Texas, sell said above described 
real estate at Public Auction to 
the highest bidder, in accor­
dance with said Order.
AND IN COMPLIANCE with 

law, I give this Notice by 
publication, in the English lan­
guage once a week for three (3) 
consecutive weeks preceding 
said day of sale, in the Bailey 
County Journal, a newspaper 
published in Bailey County, 
Texas, the first of said notices 
appearing more than twenty 
(20) days prior to the date of 
sale, 
sale.

WITNESS my hand, this 13 
day of June. 1977.

Glen Williams(s) 
Glen Williams.

Special Commissioner
25\-3tsc

Septic Tanks May 
Create Problems

Legal Nolice
PUBLIC NOTICE 

The Trustees of the Muleshoe 
Independent School District will 
offer for sale by scaled bids the 
following vechiclc:

1-45 Passenger Bus • 1973 
GMC chassis.
This bus may be inspected at 

the school bus barn between 
8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Monday 
through Friday.

Bids will be opened July II. 
1977 at 8:30 p.m. The Board 
reserves the right lo reject any 
and all bids in the best interest 
of the District..

Tom G. Jinks 
Director of Special Programs 

26s-2lc

Bethlehem Steel reports 
first quarter net loss.

GUN

WATKINS
925-6743

The move to the suburbs has 
created quite a few unexpected 
problems for many home own­
ers, and one with public health 
implications is the widespread 
use of septic tanks.
To their dismay, says the 

Texas Department of Health 
Resources, many residents have 
discovered that their soil won't 
soak up all the effluent being 
generated in their homes. This 
leads to the surfacing of septic 
tank effluent, which results in 
odorous standing water and 
breeding places for flies and 
mosquitoes. It also permits di­
rect contact with disease-carry­
ing water by humans and pets. 

New standards for construction 
of private sewage facilities are 
being developed by the Depart­
ment of Health Resources. A 
hearing is scheduled on the 
proposed standards on July 7 at 
10 a.m. at the Texas Depart­
ment of Health Resources, 1100 
W. 49th St., in Austin.
Sherman W. Hart, P.E., Chief 

of the Plans and Specifications 
Branch of the Division of Waste- 
water Technology and Surveil­
lance, says private sewage sys­
tems are usually single-owner 
types. "In addition to residen­
tial systems, however,” said 
Hart, "these can also include a 
motel, laundry, service station, 
or other commercial establish­
ment system.”

"With very few exceptions, the 
typical private sewage system is 
composed of a septic tank 
followed by a soil absorption 
system for the effluent. Nor­
mally, this is what the home 
owner has," said Hart.

Hart said approximately 20 
percent of the Texas population 
uses septic tanks, and about 95 
percent of the privale systems 
use the absorption system with 
lateral lines leading from the 
septic tank.
The residents of subdivisions, 

lake developments and indivi­
duals residing in the smaller 
towns and cities--as well as 
other rural residents-use septic 
tank systems, says Hart.
Some of the areas where 

private sewage facilities are 
constructed are just not suitable 
for septic tanks, said Hart. 
Under ideal conditions, a septic 
tank system should be located 
where soils have good permea­
bility, such as sandy loam and 
sandy clay. "However," he 
said, "we're finding that many 
of the private facilities are 
installed in rocky areas with no 
permeability, or in tight clay 
soils which won't allow passage 
of water."
"Where you have many resi­

dents and business establish­
ments moving into subdivisions 
or other areas outside cities 
which have ordinances govern­
ing the regulation of private 
sewage facilities, problems have 
arisen with developers market­
ing small lots and contractors 
providing facilities which do not 
meet recommended standards. 
This has resulted in a variety of 
problems," said Hart.
Home owners find themselves 

with an individual disposal sys­
tem which doesn't work, he 
said. In some cases, residents of 
these residential areas have had 
to construct and operate a 
central, or public, collection 
system and treatment plant at 
considerable costs, or tie in with 
nearby municipal systems, he 
said, to eliminate public health 
nuisances.
The new standards offer alter­

natives to conventional septic 
tank design, including eliminat­
ing wastewater by evaporation 
and plant transpiration. "This 
method will work very well in 
the drier areas of the slate," 
said Hart. Where sufficient land 
area is available, an inoperative 
absorptive system can be 
changed to an evaporative sys­
tem which has a much better 
chance of functioning properly, 
he said.
The construction standards arc 

intended to supply additional 
information to home owners, 
home builders and local and 
stale public health authorities in 
order to upgrade the minimum 
acceptable standards for private 
sewage facilities installed in the 
state and to try lo eliminate 
some of the problems.
Through the cooperation of the 

Texas Water Quality Board, 
counties have the option of 
adopting private sewage facility 
orders for regulating the instal­
lation of septic lank systems in 
their jurisdictions. Some 35 
counties, many of them in 
problem areas, have adopted

these orders, said Hart.
River authorities and other 
local water-oriented agencies, 
such as water districts, have 
adopted similar orders through 
the Texas Water Quality Board 
to control the pollution of 
streams and lakes under their 
jurisdictions. The Lower Colo­
rado River Authority, Trinity 
River Authority, Upper Guada­
lupe River Authority and others 
have adopted these orders for 
areas around certain specified 
lakes.
The catchall for bringing legal 

pressure to bear against some­
one who has a defective private 
sewage system is the Texas 
Sanitation Law which has exist­
ed for years to control and abate 
public health nuisances. Impro­
perly functioning septic tanks 
can lead to transmission of 
disease. Two of the more com­
mon diseases which may be 
transmitted by exposure to hu­
man wastes are infectious hepa­
titis and typhoid fever.

Hart and the Department of 
Health are hopeful that new 
standards will alleviate pro­
blems which have existed too 
long and put a blemish on the 
Utopia of suburban living.

Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service.
In general, plants used in the 

home landscape can be categor­
ized in the following manner: 
lawn and ground covers, shrub 
borders, flower beds and trees. 
Since trees usually serve a 

multipurpose role in the land­
scape, providing cnframcmcnt, 
background, screen and shade, 
they are difficult to replace and 
should generally receive priority 
when it comes to watering. 
Trees require years to become 
large enough to be effective in 
the landscape whereas a lawn or 
shrub area can be replaced in a 
season or two if weather condi­
tions are favorable. So, if the 
water supply is limited, Janne 
suggests using it to keep trees 
in as healthy a condition as 
possible even if it means sacri­
ficing other choice plants.
The horticulturist also sug­

gests a number of cultural 
practices to aid the homeowner 
in reducing water needs and 
conserving available water:

1. Use a mulch whenever 
possible. This reduces surface 
evaporation and keeps the root 
zone cooler. Good mulch mater­
ials include pine bark, wood 
shavings, straw, hay, gravel, 
plastic film and mulching paper.

2. Use soaker hoses or flood 
irrigation if possible. Sprinkler 
irrigation during the daytime 
and on windy days will result in 
high moisture losses due to 
evaporation.
3. If sprinkler irrigation is the 

only practical method available, 
use sprinkler heads that will 
allow the soil to take up the 
moisture as fast as it falls so as 
to prevent runoff.
4. Sprinkler irrigation is most 

efficient from late evening to 
early morning when the evapor-

Nursing Students To 
Texas Tech Next Tuesday
Prospective vocational nursing 

students can take an aptitude 
examination Tuesday. July 5, at 
South Plains College.
The exam, required for all 

students planning to enter 
SPC’s vocational nursing pro­
gram this fall will begin at 1 
p.m. in 113 Technical Arts 
Building. Fee is $1.
The aptitude exam also will be 

given July 18, August I and 15 
for entrance into the fall pro­
gram.
SPC’s one-year vocational nur­

sing program includes 27 weeks 
of class and lab studies plus 
observation in an area hospital 
and 23 weeks of clinical exper­
ience and on-the-job training in 
one of seven hospitals affiliated 
with the program.

Instructors arc Helen Brown, 
R.N.. program co-ordinator and 
Barbara Bennett, R.N.
Program entrance require­

ments include, in addition to the 
examination, two years of high 
school or the equivalent, a 
complete physical examination 
within six months prior to 
admission, a personal interview 
with vocational nursing instruc­
tors, moral integrity, references 
and a definite interest in nurs­
ing. Persons also should be 
between the ages of 18 and 50. 
Graduates will be eligible to 

take the state board licensure 
test qualifying them to practice 
as licensed vocational nurses. 
The program is approved and 
accredited by the Texas Educa­
tion Agency and the Texas State 
Board of Vocational Nurse 
Examiners.
Hospitals affiliated with the 

program include Cook Memor­
ial, Levclland. Medical Arts and

Littlefield Ginic and Hospital, 
both in Littlefield, Cochran 
Memorial, Morton, University 
and Highland. Lubbock and 
West Plains. Muleshoe.
For more information, contact 

either Mrs. Brown or Bill Pohl, 
SPC vocational counselor, at 
SPC, Level land, Tx 79336 or 
(806) 894-4921.

ATTENDS TRAINING.Glen 
Morris of Muleshoe, installer 
repairman for General Tele­
phone, recently attended a two- 
week training school at the 
company's training center in 
San Angelo.

Had Help
Teacher (looking over 

Teddy’s home work)-"! don't 
see how it's possible for a 
single person to make so many 
mistakes.”

Teddy (proudly)-"lt isn’t 
any single person, teacher. 
Father helped me."

MUFFLER

COMPLETE STOCK!
Free exhaust system inspection with 
muffler replacement if needed. In­
stalled quickly & guaranteed for life.

A9T9 HATS
p .a

ation rale is the lowest. This 
may increase plant disease pro­
blems, but proper use of fungi­
cides can keep these problems 
to a minimum.
5. Water thorouchlv when

irrigating. Frequent light appli­
cations ol irrigation water arc 
wastclul and encourage shallow 
root growth. When watering, 
soak the soil to a depth of six to 
eight inches.

Exception Made For Day Centers
A tax provision which denied a 

business expense deduction to 
persons providing child care 
service in their homes has been 
lifted.
This exception lo the law, part 

of the tax bill signed into law on 
Monday. May 23, 1977, elimin­
ates the exclusive use require­
ment if the residence is used to 
provide day care services to 
children, handicapped persons, 
or persons age 65 or older.

Previously, the law specified 
that deductions for business use 
of the home for child care 
services would be allowed only 
if the part of the home claimed 
was used exclusively and regu­
larly for business. For example, 
a taxpayer could not deduct a 
family room used for child care 
by day and for family entertain­
ment by night.
The exception applies for tax

years after December 31. 1975. 
However, the IRS cautioned, 
after September I, 1977, the 
exception applies only to day 
care services which comply with 
any applicable state licensing, 
certification, or approval re­
quirements.
Taxpayers who wish to claim 

the deduction for 1976 should 
file an amended return using 
Form I040X, available from IRS 
offices.

Fair Question 
Small fry to father - 

"How come soda pop will 
spoil my dinner and mar 
tinis give you an appe­
tite?”

-Sea Blade, Toledo.
• * * *

M ost people have 
generous impulses as long 
as they don’t cost money.

Jacques Discount Liquors
3800 E. Mabry Dr. Clovis

fo u r th  Of Ju ly  Specials
| Prices Good 4 PM Wed Thru 9 PM Sat

! SUPER SPECIAL
JAX BEER

II o z . Bottles
Case

1 Old
Milwaukee12 o r .  C 29 

Cans ** q

Pearl ««
Baer . Cansc 449 1«e Co,e *

Isabel Ros<
0 19A Fth

fa  ‘Lancers
Rosa
3”  fJ

v Harwood Canadian 
\A  Wkiskay O Q OSSI FromTl" X “ ”

\ Distributors O f H Gal 
Chivas Regal 80 Proof

^  White Horse
\Vy Scotch fW\ SW 86 PROOF **

79
Fth

»  Early Times 
Bourbon
so reooi H G al

Kamchatka
From

National
Distillers f t i i

Seagram’ s 
.7  Crown

80 P roo f H Gal

Jim Beam 
Bourbon

IN FULL GALLONS
Gallon

FROM OUR GUN
DEPARTMENT

HUGER MINI-14, 
SEMI-AUTOMATIC 
RIFLES IN 223 

REM. CAL. 20 

t  30 SHOT 

CLIPS AVAILABLE

00
Each

i
i



«

Page 14, Muleshoe Journal, Thursday, June X ,  1977

COTTON TALKS
fcow n a n u s  c o t i o n  & « o w « «  tw e

need to use the loan," says PCG Executive Vice President 
Donald Johnson, but if the loan is needed, the higher average
loan value will certainly be helpful."
The chart below shows a comparison of 1976 and 1977 physical 

loan prices on selected qualities common to High Plains 
production. Also shown are micronaire discounts for the two
years.

< o«r\«tnvi
" I I  KM t f i  \ M I (  OTTON

ONE INJURED IN CAR-TRUCK ACCIDENT...A mid-afternoon car/truck accident at the intersection of 
Highway 84/FM1731 sent the driver of the car to West Plains Medical Center for treatment of slight 
injuries received in the accident. Driver of the car was Henry Hettinga of Muleshoe, who was treated for 
bruises and abrasions.

Cattle Prices 
Gain, Producers 
Receive Less

A slow, steady increase in 
retail beef prices may soon be 
giving cattle producers a slight­
ly bigger piece of the beef profit 
pie. notes Dr. Ed Uvacek, a 
livestock marketing specialist 
for the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service.

‘‘Cattlemen have been suffer­
ing from an extended period of 
low prices, but retail beef prices 
have increased about five per 
cent in recent weeks. The 
national average composite re­
tail price for beef was $1.41 per 
pound the third week of May,” 
notes Uvacek.
Choice fed steers in that same 

week averaged $40.86 per hun­
dredweight, up 11 per cent over 
the March average price.
Consumers have been paying 

more for their beef mainly due 
to both the higher cattle prices 
and an increase in the cost of 
marketing. This latter cost, of 
course, does not benefit cattle 
producers, says the Texas A&M 
University System specialist.
"The marketing part of the 

beef industry has accounted for 
a larger and larger portion of the 
consumer's dollar spent on 
beef," says Uvacek. "More 
money was paid into higher 
labor rates, transportation costs 
and packaging. This left the 
producer with a smaller piece of 
beef profit pie."
While the farm-to-retail price 

spread dropped substantially in 
April and early May. it has 
jumped back up again during 
recent weeks. The only hope for 
cattlemen, therefore, is higher 
retail prices to the consumer.

The price at which typical High Plains cotton will enter the 
Commodity Credit Corporation loan in 1977 will be about 5.6 
cents higher than the same qualities in 1976 according to 
calculations of Lubbock-based Plains Cotton Growers, Inc.

The national base loan rate for Strict Low Middling 1-1/16 inch 
cotton this year is 44.63 cents, up 5.71 cents from 1976. USDA 
set the loan at High Plains warehouse locations at 44.60 cents, up 
5.75 cents from the 38.85 cent rate on the Plains last year.

But a small portion of this base increase will be lost to High 
Plains farmers by reason of increased discounts for qualities 
below the base. Grade and staple discounts in 1977 are an 
average 27 points (.27 cents) greater than 1976, but smaller 
discounts on cotton with below 3.5 micronaire will offset about 13 
points of this.

Basis for these calculations. PCG officials state, is the average 
of qualities produced on the High Plains in the 1971 to 1975 crop 
years.

"Hopefully market prices this Fall will be such that we won't

t ;  ::: i::: **

UHRO*Wtl ixvnt

Little do men perceive 
what solitude is, and 
how far it extendeth. 

-Francis Bacon

Solitude excludes pleas­
ure, and does not al­
ways secure peace. 

-Samuel Johnson.

BIBLE VERSE
"Clean'll' your hand'., 

ye  sinners, and purify  
your hearts, ye  double 
minded. ”
1. Who was the author of 
the above admonition?
2. What position did he 
hold in the early church?
3. To whom was he writ­
ing?
4. Where may this verse 
be found?

Answers Jo B ib it Verse

1. Jam es- p robab ly  the 
half brother of Jesus.
2. If th is  Ja m es  was 
J e s u s ’ h a lf-b ro th e r , he 
was head of the early 
church in Jerusalem.
3. To "the  twelve tribes 
scattered abroad.”
4. The last part of Jam es 
4:8.

SUGARS
PURE CANE 
511.  BAG

THE HEAT, 
ome By Saturday 

For Free Coke & Ice 
Cream. A t The Same 

Time, You Can Do You 
rocery Shopping Earl

Cashway Will Be, -
Closed Monday,

QUALITY MEATS
Horne Is Kolbase

POLISH SAUSAGE ..i°?.-..?h?.-.$1.29
Hormels Range Brand Thick O r Thin Sliced

BACON................. .?..i*,fta,$2.89
Hormels Little Sizzler

SAUSAGE LINKS 89*
Prices Home Style

PIMENTO SPREAD is, ^,$1,391
Swifts Premium Proten Beef

(RANCH STEAK * 98*
Swifts Premium Proten Beef

RIB STEAK Lb..98*
Amours Star Deluxe

GROUND BEEF 
PATTIES 2 Lb. Pkg. S I . 9 5  

....................

Library
J

News
By Anne  C a m p

LISTEN TO THEMULETRAIN 
10:15 a.m. MONDAY-FRIDAY 
OVER KMUL 
SPONSORED BY 
WHITES CASH WAY

Over 200 boys and girls have 
joined the Jungle Journey Read­
ing Club at the Muleshoe Area 
Public Library....many have 
read the required number, and 
received their certificates..there 
is still plenty of time to partici­
pate...and enjoy, not only read­
ing and earning awards, but the 
films that are shown every 
Wednesday morning.

Last week 50 children saw the 
film-"A day at the zoo” , and 53 
children saw "The Owl and the 
Pussycat” . The library will con­
tinue to show these films thru 
the month of July, and on 
August 1st a Recognition day 
program will be held to honor all 
children who participated in the 
Summer program. An Honor 
Roll will be sent to the Schools 
to show all who completed the 
reading requirements and re­
ceived certificates and awards. 

For your Summer Work, and 
Summer Fun-Books can help! 
In the first category-new mater­
ial on gardening; home im­
provement; starting a business; 
putting foods by (canning, pre­
serving); woodworking; electri­
cal wiring; and others will be 
featured on the “ browse table". 
In the “ for Fun" titles such as: 
Complete book of Camping; 
Trailering; Jack Nicklaus' les­
son tec (GolD; Guide to tropical 
aquarium fishes; complete book 
of Square dancing; Acrylic Wat- 
ercolor Painting; Tcnais by Pan 
cho Gonzales; Every Room a 
Garden (indoor plants) and 
others will be featured-so 
whether Summer means work of 
fun--the library has something 
for everyone!
The Library will be closed 

Monday for July 4th.

Real success in life is 
not m easu red  by how 
many individuals you ex­
cel but by how many peo­
ple you befriend.

N.Y. City gets $255-million 
federal loan.

California Hass-Large Size

A V O C A D O S 5/$1
.. . '  v  yCalifornia Red Beaut

PLUM S...........j*„494
Arizona Garden Fresh A  M l  A  M l  M  ^ |

cARROTs m B A N A N A S !
Dole Golden Ripe

4.81
WE WELCOME 

USDA
FOODSTAMP 

COUPONS

This Coupon is good for 100 
EXTRA G U N N  BROS. STAMPS 

At WHITES CASHWAY 
With the purchase of $7.50 or more

Name

O nly one coupon per customer.

SALAD
G

COME TO 
CASHWAY 
FOR YOUR 
WIC CARD 

PURCHASES

Whites
CASHWAY
7 :3 0 a . . .  t i l  9 : 0 0 p . . .  MONDAY-SATURDAY

CLOSED SUNDAY
Doable G a n  Bros. S t e p s  Every Wednesday 

We Reserve Tbe Right To L i . i t  Q .a a t i t i . s

FROZEN FOOD

SPECIALS
2 Lb. Pkg. O re-lda

TATER TOTS......................... 694
8 O z .  Pkg. Fisher Boy

FISH STICKS....... ...............454
20 O z .  Pkg. Blue Morrow

BEEF FRITTERS ...................... 6 9 t
9 O z . Pkg. Mrs Pauls Fried

ONION RINGS....................... 65
* Y >  'V ) *I .  -- * r.

FOOD BARGA/IUS
100 Count Bottle Bayer

ASPIRIN............................................$1.19
I G allon Q uality Checked Chocolate

BREAKFAST DRINK......................... $1.39
32 O z .  Bottle Hunts

TOMATO KETCHUP............................. 794
10 1/2 O z .  Can Mortons

BEAN OR TACO DIP.............................494
6 O z .  Pkg. Mortons Reg., B . B . Q .  , Sour Cream

POTATO CHIPS.....................................594
3 O z . Jar Nestles

INSTANT TEA.................................... $ U 9 |
46 O z .  Can Hunts Fancy

TOMATO JUICE.....................................594
4 Roll Pkg. Arrow

BATHROOM TISSUE............................ 7941
13 O z .  Can Pet

EVAPORATED M ILK .......................... 3 /$ l
14 O z .  Can

EAGLE BRAND MILK........................... 694
40 Count Pkg. Diamond

PAPER PLATES............................... $1.19
25 Sq. Ft. Reg. Roll

REYNOLDS WRAP................................39e|
14 O z .  Can Disinfectant

LYS0L SPRAY.................................$1.69
4 Bar Pak Coast

BATH SOAP...................................... $1.09
1/2 G allon Liquid Wisk

DETERGENT...................................... $2.5>

0 I


