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around

Muleshoe
At 6:20 a.m. Wednesday, local 

firemen were called to the 
Myron Pool. Jr., home approxi­
mately 10 miles northwest of 
Muleshoe for a fire.

Fire Chief H.E. Reeder, Jr., 
said the fire damaged a portion 
of the floor and one wall in the 
kitchen of the home. He said the 
fire was apparently caused by 
an electrical short.

• • * • *
Mr. and Mrs. Roy L. Macfar- 

land of Sloughbucks, England, 
were Easter weekend visitors in 
the home of his sister, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bemis Camp. Accompany­
ing the Macfarlands were Mr. 
and Mrs. Barry Smith, also from' 
England.
They spent a part of the 

holiday at Lake Meredith.
•  •  •  * •

E/3 Randy Williams, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie F. Wil­
liams, is visiting his parents this 
week. He is stationed at Fort 
Sill. Okla. and will leave Sunday 
to return to his base.

* • • •  •
Easter weekend visitors in 

Muleshoe include Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Small and children of 
Dumas. They spent the week­
end visiting with local friends.

* • * * •
Lawren Hall has achieved 

Southern Methodist Universi­
ty’s annual “ Honor Roll” of 
scholars for her high grade 
achievement, according to an 
announcement from the univer­
sity at Dallas.

She is the daughter of L.B. 
Hall of Muleshoe and Jessica 
Perry Hall of San Antonio. 

*****
Bill Durham, Texas Tech Uni­

versity freshman theatre arts 
major from Muleshoe, will be a 
member of the chorus in the 
university's production of 
“ Oedipus the King” April 15- 
20.

He has appeared in the Univer­
sity’s production of "A Funny 
Thing Happened on the Way to 
the Forum" and “The Royal 
Hunt of the Sun’’.

• • • • »
Mr. and Mrs. Ben Yeager are 

among Texans who are attend­
ing the Texas Grain and Feed 
Association convention in Hous­
ton starting today (Thursday). 
The convention is expected to 

conclude Saturday afternoon. 
*** * *

Mr. and Mrs. T.C. McWilliams 
of Muleshoe received Easter 
Greetings from their son and 
daughter-in-law, S/Sgt. and 
Mrs. Mike McWilliams and 
Timothy Charles. They are liv­
ing in Frankfurt, Germany, 
where he is stationed with the 
Armed Forces. The McWilliams 
had not talked to their daughter- 
in-law in over a year.

*** * *
Jack Griswold of Muleshoe 

Beauty Salon, attended a Red- 
ken Educational Seminar. April 
2-4 on haircuts, blow drying and 
other beauty fashions. The sem­
inar was held at the South Park 
Inn in Lubbock.

• * * • •
Judy Dearing, a junior Home 

Economics major at Texas Tech 
University, has been elected 
treasurer for the Vocational 
Homemaking Teachers Associ­
ation of Texas Student Section 
for 1977-1978. She is the daugh­
ter of Mrs. B.A. Dearing.

Miss Tri-County 
Entries Coming In

Police Chase Ended 
With Wreck, Arrests

Hey, young fellow! Is your girl 
friend pretty? How about con­
vincing her she should enter the 
Miss Tri-County Beauty Pa­
geant in Muleshoe. Monday is 
the final date for entry in the 
pageant which will be staged at 
8 p.m. Saturday. April 23 in the 
Muleshoe High School auditori­
um. Muleshoe Jaycees are 
sponsoring the pageant with 
Johnny St. Clair, chairman as­
sisted by Terry Gunter.

Formerly called the Miss 
Muleshoe Pageant. Miss Tri- 
County could be from Mule­
shoe, Lariat. Three Way, Bula, 
Needmore. anywhere in Bailey 
County. Or, she may be the local 
beauty from Lazbuddie. Earth 
or Sudan. This year, Parmer 
County and Lamb County have 
been included in the pageant, 
and a number of contestants are 
expected to parade across the 
stage for Miss Tri-County or 
Little Miss Tri-County.
And, how about this bonus! St. 

Clair's Department Store,

Spelling Bee
Fha inpion
To ( Compete

Bailey County's spelling cham­
pion, Tim Sain, will join 15 other 
youngsters from area counties 
in competition at the Regional 
Spelling Bee scheduled Satur­
day, April 16.

He will be competing in Moody 
auditorium at Lubbock Christian 
College beginning at 12:30 p.m. 
Tim won the local spelling bee 

in competition on March 24, 
giving him the county cham­
pionship. He is a 13-year-old 
seventh grader, and the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Walter Sain. He 
will be one of four boys in the 
competition, with 12 girls.
The bee will be conducted 

under the supervision of Frankie 
Faver, LCC director of continu­
ing education, and the top six 
contestants will be receiving 
special prizes. All 16 contest­
ants will receive plaques com­
memorating their county cham­
pionships.

Signup,  Tryout
Scheduled For 
Little League

With Little League getting off 
to a start for the 1977 season, 
sign-up is scheduled for tonight 
(Thursday) at 7:30 p.m. in the 
Mary DeShazo cafeteria.
All potential players who have 

never played with the Muleshoe 
Little League are asked to be 
present for sign-up, along with 
your parents.
Tryouts are slated for Saturday 

afternoon at the Mary DeShazo 
playground, north of the school 
and practice will start Monday. 
April 18. At tryouts, drafts will 
be conducted and player rosters 
completed.

First game for the 1977 season 
will be Monday, May 2, at Little 
League park.

Cobb’s Department Store, An­
thony's, Buddy’s Shoes and 
BurSinger Fashions have gone 
together to add an incentive. 
Gift certificates, compliments of 
the stores named, will be pre­
sented. A SI50 gift certificate 
will be presented the winner 
and a S75 gift certificate will be 
presented the first runner-up. 
Little Miss Tri-County will be 
presented a $25 gift certificate.
Also, for all contestants, Sha­

fer Studio will do one setting for 
black and white glossy print for 
the newspaper and the program 
for both Miss Tri-County and 
Little Miss. They will also do 
one color setting for each con­
testant with no obligation. Miss 
Tri-County will receive free, 
from the studio, a color 16 x 20 
portrait.

Decorator 216 will be doing the 
stage decorations for the pa­
geant and the Muleshoe High 
School stage band will perform 
during the show. Also, a group 
of young gymnists will be 
performing.
The winner of Miss Tri-County 

will also have a free trip to 
Perryton to compete in the Miss 
Wheatheart of the Nation pa­
geant later this year.

By presstime Tuesday eve­
ning, several contestants had 
entered. They include Candy 
Moore, 17, a junior at Lazbuddie 
High School. She is the daug- 
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Moore, and is sponsored by Bill 
Maddox Trucking Co.
Dani Dunham. 16. is a junior at 

Muleshoe High School. She is 
sponsored by St. Clair's and is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Dunham.
Cynthia Isaac is 18 and a senior 

at Muleshoe High School. Her 
sponsor is the Fair Store and she 
is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Isaac.

Eighteen year old Patti Poynor 
is a senior at Muleshoe High 
School and the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Haney Poynor. She is 
sponsored by Poynor’s White 
Stores.
At least six entries are expect­

ed from Earth.
To date, the only Little Miss 

Tri-County contestant is Tonya 
Sisemore, age seven, and the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Sisemore.
Tu-Tu King of Lubbock, who 

will be presenting some of her 
students in entertainment at the 
pageant will be available to 
assist with contestants in help­
ing them with stage poise and 
walk.

PICKUP WRECK HOSPTTA1JZES ONE . . . John Street, 20, was hospitalized early Sunday morning for 
treatment of injuries received in the wreck of his pickup. He was a passenger in the pickup which was 
driven by Larry Ross when Ross lost control approximately three miles south of Muleshoe. The pickup 
overturned, coming to rest against the tree in the background.

Tying Trout Flies 
Local Man’s Hobby

Four years ago. Edd Edmiston 
started a lucrative hobby! He 
had become interested in trout 
flies made by an acquaintance in 
Colorado. He had watched a 
game warden for the Colorado 
Game and Fish Department 
make several flies and derided 
to learn to make them.

Starting out. Edmiston said he

Jaycees Name 
New Officers 
In Election
New officers were elected for 

the Muleshoe Jaycees Monday 
night in an election held at the 
Production Credit Association 
building.

Included are Monty Dollar, 
president; Hugh Young, first 
vice president; Mike Jester, 
second vice president; Kim 
Bales, secretary; Mack Hodges, 
reporter; Gary Bender, treasur­
er and Gene McGuire, state 
director.

Local directors elected include 
Terry Hill, Marty McGuire. 
Ricky Mata. Rusty Whitt and 
Kenny Kittrell.

Chamber President 
Clark Has Resigned

At a regular board meeting of 
the Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture Tuesday 
morning, expressing his re­
grets, John Clark, president, 
submitted his resignation.
Clark, who assumed the office 

of president February 1, submit­
ted his resignation due to busi­
ness pressures in having his 
company located at Denison and

FLY TYING IS HOBBY . . .  When Edd Edmiston sits down amid his feathers, thread, and hooks, he ends 
up with bugs and worms. Making flics for trout fishing has become a lucrative hobby for the local man.

the time required there. He said 
that in the near future, he and 
his family would be moving to 
Denison to make their home and 
explained that it was becoming 
increasingly difficult to have his 
company located in one area and 
his home in another location.
He said he would like to 

express his appreciation to the 
Muleshoe Chamber of Com­
merce and Agriculture Board of 
Directors, Vice President How­
ard Watson, who has been pinch 
hitter for him recently in many 
instances, and to the local 
people for their cooperation and 
attitude.

Watson agreed to accept the 
presidency of the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce and 
Agriculture and was named to 
replace Clark.
Also discussed during the 

board meeting were projected 
expenditures which were 
approved. Board members re­
viewed the blue prints for the 
Baicy County Exhibition build­
ing and expressed their appreci­
ation and approval of the Bailey 
County Commissioners Court 
for their forcsightcdness in 
planning the structure.

Bailey County Judge Glen 
Williams told Tommy Black, 
executive director of the Cham 
ber of Commerce and Agricul­
ture, that bids will be opened on 
May 9 for study and bids will be 
awarded on May 12. Construc­
tion on the facility is expected to
Coni, on Page 3. Col. 5

had made some mistakes, 
took the flies to the game 
warden near Creede. Colo, and 
Mr. Henshaw showed him how 
to make them properly. He said 
that the game warden, whose 
first name he can no longer 
remember, had spent 28 years 
as a game warden in the Rio 
Grande Wilderness and had 
perfected five flies which work­
ed the best in trout fishing.

Henshaw settled for five flies 
after testing hundreds in the 
Rio Grande Wilderness. They 
were:
Old Faithful, which is a dupli­

cate of a bug that hatches in the 
water around the first of May 
and will be found in water at all 
times until it freezes in the fall. 
The Old Faithful fly, which has 

proven to be the most success­
ful, was tied with pale green 
wool chenille, and a pheasant 
feather from the back of a mail 
ringneck pheasant, with legs 
and feelers of black hackles 
from a back game rooster. 

Edmiston said he has substi­
tuted a light green chenille to 
use a peacock feather which 
makes a more true fly. and body 
of the bug that lives in the 
water.
The Brown Wooly Worm, 

weighted, is made from brown 
wool chenille and his brown 
hackle comes from the neck of a 
brown game rooster.

A Green Wooly Worm is made 
the same way and is also 
weighted, but his hackle is a 
grey hackle from a grey game 
rooster.
The fifth popular fly is a black 

ant. which swarms from mid- 
July to the latter part of the 
month each year.

"In my experience in fishing." 
said Edmiston. “ if a fish won't 
hit one of these five flies, you 
may as well pack your rods and 
go home."

Each year, for the past 29 
years. Edmiston, his family and 
other local residents have gone 
to Colorado to Wagon Wheel 
Gap to fish, he has used the five

Traffic Islands 
To lie Removed 
For Repair
The islands on US 70 and 

SH2I4 arc being removed, with 
removal work starting Wednes­
day. April 13.

A spokesman for the State 
Department of Highways and 
Public Transportation said turn 
lanes will be replaced instead of 
the traffic islands.
The spokesman said they think 

the turn lanes will better serve 
the public and said they regret­
ted the temporary inconveni­
ence the removal will cause. 

Local workmen for the Texas 
Department of Highways and 
Public Transportation arc in the 
process of doing the renovation 
work at the intersection.

flies, especially Old Faithful and 
has many stories to tell about 
catching his limit, while people 
all around him fail to catch 
anything. He backs up his 
catches with pictures, and with 
his famous annual fish fry. Each 
year, he invites friends to a fish 
fry where he serves his catches 
from the year.

Edmiston keeps his fly tying 
equipment in a storage house in 
the spring and only in winter 
docs he move it into the house to 
work during the winter. With 
enough materials on hand to tie 
some 25,000-30,000 flies at this 
time, he has gotten the fly tying 
down to a science, being able to 
tie a fly in approximately three 
to four minutes.
This is using some standard 

materials, such as fly vise, 
thread bobbins, and scissors. 
He has also contrived his own 
devises for straightening fea­
thers and adding double half 
hitch loops to the head of the 
flies.

Henshaw taught his son. Glen, 
to tie the flies and Henshaw flies
Cont. on Page 3, Col. 2

A wild police chase by Sudan 
officers, who were joined by 
Muleshoe officers, ended in 
Muleshoe late Saturday night, 
when a late model care was 
finally stopped after colliding 
with a local care, to head 
weekend violence and crime. 

Sudan City Marshal Lanny 
Rice radioed Muleshoe Law 
Enforcement Center that he was 
chasing a care west toward 
Muleshoe at speeds exceeding 
120 miles per hour. At the time 
he called, he was near the 
Lubbock Water Works, some 
nine miles east of Muleshoe on 
Highway 84. By the time Mule­
shoe City officers got to the east 
side of town, the race went by 
them. The turned around and 
joined the chase which was 
entering Muleshoe slightly a- 
bove 90 miles an hour at that 
time, in heavy Saturday night 
traffic.
Weaving through the traffic, 

the vehicles made it to the west 
side of Muleshoe where the 
pursued vehicle slammed into 
the back of a car traveling west 
on 84, and spun out of control. 
The car they hit, which was 

occupied by the John Puckett 
family, was airborne briefly, 
coming down partially on the 
median in the eastbound traffic- 
lane. stopping about a half a 
block away. The other car spun 
around and came to a stop 
against the median in the inter­
section in the 1400 block of West 
American Blvd.

Mr. and Mrs. Ken Angeley, 
who had witnessed the end of 
the chase, stopped and Mrs. 
Angeley immediately took nine

Girls Softball 
Signup Slated 
In This Week

Little League is getting under­
way, and it's time to turn 
thoughts to Girl’s Softball. At 
this time, a program is under­
way to re-organize for the 1977 
season.
At the time, permission slips 

for girls to participate are being 
sent to local schools. Girls ages 
eight through 12 are eligible for 
the league with April 15 being 
the final date for sign-up.
Play is expected to begin 

during the first week of May and 
the girls will have their own 
playing area this year.

For further information contact 
Mrs. John Harris at 272-4475 or 
272-4383; or Mrs. Lyndon Huck- 
aby at 272-3463.

Storm Sentry Alert 
May Save Your Life

How much is your life worth?
Is your life, or the life of your 
loved ones worth $30? Can you 
afford NOT to be caught with a 
Storm Sentry Disaster Alarm 
System?

Help Kiwanis Club of Mule­
shoe help you. They are in the 
process of attempting to assure 
continued safety for the resi­
dents of not only Muleshoe, but 
the entire area, through the 
Storm Sentry.
This year, with the severe 

weather season right upon us, 
the Kiwanis Club will be selling 
the Storm Sentry Disaster A- 
larm System, down $5 from the 
$35 charged when they went on 
sale in the area last year.
Their operation is very simple. 

Two knobs control the system to 
preset it and nearly forget it. If 
you are in the range of KMUL 
Radio, the designated alert sta­
tion in this area. Storm Sentry 
will work for you. You can take it 
in your vehicle, on the tractor, to 
the garden, to the office, in your 
home, or wherever you may be 
in range of the radio station.
The Storm Sentry Alert System 

will operate on standard electri­
cal current and also has a 
battery standby in case power 
fails or you will want to use it 
where electrical power is not 
immediately available, 

h is economical to use. costing 
only pennies to operate, and is 
always ready, 24 hours a day, to 
serve you when and if needed. It 
makes a decorative addition to 
yiiur home or office and even 
w cn used once, is immediately 
ready for further use.

Another feature is the automa­
tic-manual switch. You can op­
erate the system just as a radio 
by switching to manual opera­
tion, or turn on the automatic 
switch, and the system is ready 
to turn on at any time threaten-

Cont. on Page 3. Col. 6

year old Connie Puckett to the 
hospital for treatment of rib 
injuries. Officers who were in 
pursuit of the vehicle that hit the 
Puckett car, took the four occu­
pants into custody and searched 
the badly wrecked car. Local 
officers were Fabian Flores and 
Forrist Williams.
Monday, the drive of the 

vehicle paid a city fine of 
$157.50, and was released on a 
$750 county bond for additional 
charges he faces. He was charg­
ed with driving while intoxi­
cated. contributing to delin­
quency of a minor and posses­
sion of marijuana.
The other three occupants of 

the vehicle, who were all from 
Lubbock, were charged with 
possession of marijuana; minor 
possession of liquor and posses­
sion of marijuana and contribut­
ing to the delinquency of a 
minor and possession of mari­
juana. The four youths have all 
been released on bonds at

Cont. on Page 3. Col. 6

Beef Seminar 
Will Feature 
Specialists

Do you have questions about 
how to choose beef? Or, what 
are economical cuts and how to 
prepare them? Or, what to look 
for in choosing quality beef for 
your table?
These, and many more ques­

tions may be answered on 
Wednesday. April 20, at a beel 
seminar sponsored jointly by 
Spencer Tanksley and Robin 
Taylor of the County Extension 
office.
They are sponsoring the semi­

nar from 2-4 p.m. in the 
Fellowship Hall of the First 
United Methodist Church.
The educational program on 

meat will feature three special­
ists.
Dr. Frank Orts. a meat special­

ist from Texas A&M, will cut up 
a beef quarter and show differ­
ent cuts and how to look for 
quality.

Buying meats, and their nutri­
ents will be featured by Mrs. 
Sally Coble, a food and nutrition 
specialist from Texas A&M. 
Tenderizers and their use will 

be the special feature of Cather­
ine Berry, home economist for 
Furr Food.
A special feature of the semi­

nar will be a taste panel. 
Panelists will be testing various 
cuts of beef, all the same, and 
prepared the same way. They 
will test for differences in grain 
fed beef and grass fed beef; also 
will taste test mature beef, 
versus baby beef.
The taste panel will explain the 

different facets of the beef as 
prepared and tell how to check 
for tenderness, flavor and all the 
qualities looked for by the 
consumer.
Tanksley and Mrs. Taylor said 

that anyone interested will be 
cordially welcomed at the free 
seminar.

BE AT EASE WITH STORM SENTRY Regardless whether you 
arc al work, as Nonic Huckleberry is here, or al home, or at plav. a 
Storm Sentry Disaster Alert System could be your life saver in a bad 
weather storm.
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Rising Energy Prices Stopping Irrigation
Approximately six million 

of irrigated crop land in 
the Texas High Plains could be 

high and dry because ot 
prices of energy used in

powering irrigation pumps.
Dr. Kenneth P. Young, of the 

Agricultural Economics faculty 
at Texas Tech University, said 
he conducted research to deter-

Universal Treating 
Co., Inc.

Water Well 
Acidizing

No Job Too Small 
Or Too Large

Call Collect

Universal Treating 
Co., Inc.

U velland , Texas 
806-894-6125

mine impact of rising energy 
prices on agricultural produc­
tion in the High Plains.
The study included effect of 

higher energy prices on compe­
tition with other agricultural 
areas for production of major 
crops, cropping patterns, de­
cline in irrigated acreage, farm 
income and land values.

Higher energy prices could 
have national impact, creating a 
new focus on the High Plains’ 
importance as an area of pro­
duction but, at the same time, 
eventually result in a possible 
decline in the numbers of people 
engaged in farming in this area. 
The research strongly indicates 

that higher energy prices are 
causing a shift to smaller irriga­
tion applications per acres of 
crop land and some movement 
from irrigated crops to dryland. 

Smaller irrigation applications 
and dryland farming reduce 
crop yield per acre. This could 
have a two-fold effect: a reduc­
tion in supply of certain com­
modities. especially crops re­
quiring intensive irrigation, and 
a lessening of farm income. 

“The High Plains will be at 
some economic disadvantage 
with other production areas 
which require less irrigation. 
Farmers on the High Plains will 
be producing less at higher 
production costs due to increas­
ed costs of irrigation," Young 
said.
“ There may even be a shift in 

cotton production. The High

Plains has had a production cost 
advantage over southeastern ar­
eas because of leack of insect 
problems. However, rising na­
tural gas prices may change 
this."

Lower farm income implies 
lower land values. Higher natur­
al gas prices may discourage 
farmers from paying higher 
prices demanded for irrigated 
land, again decreasing land 
value.

“ An additional problem," 
Young said, "is that some utility 
firms apparently are not accept­
ing new customers. One report 
attributes this to the fact that 
pipelines are already operating 
at capacity, and the utility firms 
may lack incentive to invest in 
more pipelines because of the 
uncertainty of continued High 
Plains irrigation."
As a result, some farmers have 

to turn to electricity or diesel 
fuel, but on the High Plains 
electricity is derived from gen­
eration powered by natural gas. 
Higher natural gas prices thus 
affect the supply of electricity, 
while diesel prices are also 
rising, he said.

ON U.S. TRAVEL
For the first time since 

1950, Americans are free to 
travel anywhere in the world 
without restrictions on the use 
of their passports. The ban­
ning of travel to Cuba, North 
Korea, Vietnam and Cambodia 
has expired.

He was assisted in his re­
search, conducted for the Texas 
Governor's Energy Council, by 
High Plains Underground Wa­
ter Conservation District One.

Oranga tower 
heralds books

AUSTIN, Texas (Spl) -  
The 307-foot Tower at The 
University of Texas was 
lighted orange one night 
recently, not to herald a 
Longhorn athletic victory but 
something far more signifi­
cant — the addition to the UT 
Austin Library of its four 
millionth volume

Help keep 
our forest 
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smoking.

Useyour
ashtray.

Don’t be careless 
with the future
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Store Hours 9 a.m.-6 p.m.
HOME FURNISHINGS
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Dan River3 “Ingenue” Sheets
T W IN  Reg. 3 .99  FULL Reg. 4 .9 9

2 - 7
2  for 5.50

3”
2 for $7

QUEEN Reg. 8.99  
K IN G  Reg. 10.99 
Reg. CASES Reg. 3 .49 pr. 
K IN G  CASES Reg. 3 .99  pr.

6 .4 7  2 for $12
8 .4 7  2 for $16  

2 .75  pr. 
3 .25  pr.

Welcome to our garden —  Just introduced . . . flowering 
"Ingenue" is already o favorite with decorators who 
like to see it repeated throughout o room: over win­
dows; on pillows, and, of course, on the bed. It's a 
fresh happy pattern in core free Celanese* Fortrel® poly­
ester and cotton. Beautiful multiprint on beige ground. 
Flat ond Fitted.

S J A T E  C A P I T A L

Hiqhliqhi’S  
SideliqhtsA N D

by Lyndell W iliam s
T E X A S  P R E S S  A S S O C I A T I O N

AUSTIN -  A $528 mill­
ion finance bill — most 
monumental achievement 
of the legislature to date — 
finally  wound its  way 
through the legislature and 
moved to the governor’s 
desk.

Gov. Dolph Briscoe, who 
tagged the  m easure an 
emergency and plugged for 
it in both houses, ap ­
plauded passage and 
promptly scheduled signing 
ceremonies this week

The bill was deadlocked 
for six weeks in Senate 
sub-com m ittee afte r Lt. 
Gov. Bill Hobby insisted 
th e  $674 m illion House 
version was excessive.

After Hobby engineered 
a compromise on a $428 
million bill with a built-in 
in fla tion -ad ju sting  m e­
chanism  to take care of 
future needs, new trouble 
developed in the Senate.

Briscoe held out for 
another $100 million to re­
pair w eather-dam aged 
roads, and Hobby agreed

Several senators, includ­
ing A. R. Schwartz of Gal­
veston and Lloyd Doggett of 
A ustin , who w eren’t too 
keen on the highway de­
partm en t getting  firs t 
crack at a big bundle of 
money, waged a b a ttle  
against the compromise in 
the Senate. Schwartz was 
particularly irate about ad­
dition of the last $100 mill­
ion.

Schw artz and Doggett 
claimed commitment of the 
additional revenue to 
highw ays killed a $258 
million tax cut passed by 
the House. Hobby agreed 
there is now no chance for 
e lim ination  of the s ta te

65th session
Major business — includ­

ing school finance legisla­
tion and a $15.6 billion 
general appropriations bill 
for 1978-79 — awaited the 
House this week. The gov­
ernor tagged school finance 
as an emergency.

The Senate may see its 
F inance C om m ittee’s 
budget bill next week and 
its Education Committee’s 
school funding proposals 
soon thereafter.

Presiding officers of both 
houses and Gov. Briscoe are 
optimistic over chances for 
an early windup of the ses­
sion But most observers 
conclude that, realistically, 
legislators aren’t likely to 
adjourn before the 140-day 
deadline at the end of May.

Presiding officers and the 
governor are convinced ac­
complishments will be sig­
nificant.
M alpractice D ebate Set

The Senate will begin 
debate on a medical mal­
practice compromise bill 
April 18.

The Senate J u r is p ru ­
dence Committee advanced 
the House-passed measure 
to the floor with no more 
than  technical changes, 
postponing the big fight 
over amendments.

Doctors, tr ia l law yers

and insurance companies 
are squared away for the 
showdown battle.

P rostitu tion  C urbed

Legislation to increase 
penalties for prostitution 
passed the House last week

New penalties <up to 
$1,000 fine and 180 days in 
jail in first ofTensc) would 
apply to both parties to a 
solicitation. Another meas­
ure passed overwhelmingly 
by the House extends 
penalties to those who sol­
icit others to engage in sex 
for pay

AG Rules

Atty. Gen. John Hill up­
held in general constitu­
tionality  of medical m al­
practice bill before the Se­
nate Jurisprudence Com­
mittee.

In other recent opinions. 
Hill concluded:

The sales tax on residen­
tial utility  bills could be 
wiped out without abolish­
ing the levy on commercial 
users.

Home rule cities may re­
quire public officials to file 
financial disclosure sta te­
ments on their assets and 
incomes.

A bill au thorizing  a 
supervisory committee to 
operate a regional jail pres­
ents no constitutional ques­
tion.

The open records act does 
not require disclosure of the 
nam e of a person who 
lodged a com plaint with 
another to a city anim al 
control division.

General partners of a li­
mited partnership operat­
ing under an assum ed 
name must execute and file 
an "assumed name certifi­
cate" with the county clerk.

>a Franklin Welding ' *

& M illwork
Friona Hwy.

sales tax in utility bills, but 
Briscoe insisted the levy 
can still be taken off.

Over a 20 year period, 
the compromise bill will 
provide more money for 
highway building than the 
orig inal House version. 
Briscoe had requested 
about $825 million in his 
in itia l recom m endations 
for additional highway 
funding.

Session Speeding

The legislature, follow­
ing an E aster recess, 
shifted gears for the final 
month and a half of the

Grain Bin & Dryer Setups 
Elevator & Feedmill Repair

Castom B a c k h o o ,  M o to r  C r a i n ,  

D r a g l l a a ,  W a i c l i  T r i c k s  l  W a lda rs

O f f ic a :  
^ 2 7 2 - 3 2 8 0

H o s t :
272-4316 I U

fivindPwof
The Trinity Baptist Church 

Invites YOU To A
REVIVAL

April 17th Thru 20th
Saaday -W adnasday

S in d a y - R e g a la r  Worsh ip  Hoars 
M o a d a y - W a d a t s d a y - 8  p.m.

With 5 Speakers -One Each Service
Rev. Ron Trussler
Calvary  B a p t i s t ,  Fr iona

Rev. Raymond Jones
Sannys ida B a p t i s t  Charch

Rev. Moody Smith
Oklahoma Lana B a p t i s t  Charch

Rev. Doag Gardener
C i rd o b a c k  B a p t i s t  Charch

Rev. Danny Carry
Prog rass  B a p t i s t  Charch

Special Music Will 
Feature Local Talent

G erald  Shanks W ill Be In Charge O f M usic

The Nursery Will Be Open
David_Evetts ,  Fas to r  T r i n i t y  B a p t i s t  Charch
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Area Ministers To 
Speak At Trinity
The members of Trinity Baptist 

Church invite the residents of 
Muleshoe and the surrounding 
area to participate with them in 
declaring "The Good News of 
Jesus Christ" to West Texas, 
said the pastor, Rev. David 
Evetts.
Trinity Baptist Church's reviv­

al for Good News Texas will be 
conducted at the church April 17 
through April 20.
The revival is in conjunction 

with the Southern Baptist 
churches across the State of 
Texas. The goal is to present the 
message of Salvation by Grace 
at least 40 times to every Texan, 
said the minister.
Five guest evangelists will 

speak each day beginning Sun­
day morning and continuing 
through Wednesday evening. 
Speakers are Rev. Ron Trussler, 
pastor of Calvary Baptist 
Church, Friona; Rev. Raymon 
Jones, pastor of Sunnyside Bap­
tist Church; Rev. Moody Smith, 
pastor of Oklahoma Lane Bap­
tist Church; Rev. Doug Gard­
ner, pastor of Circle Back Bap­
tist Church and Rev. Danny 
Curry, pastor of Progress Bap­
tist Church.
All Sunday services of April 17 

will be at regular times; Sunday 
School, 9:45 a.m.; Worship at 11 
a.m.; Church Training at 6 p.m. 
and evening worship at 8 p.m. 
Services Monday through Wed­
nesday will be at 8 p.m.
“ Each of the guest churches 

will have at least one local 
Christian who will give their ' 
“ Living P roof testimony that 
Jesus Christ is the answer to 
happy living," said Rev. Evetts. 
Special music has been plan­

ned, which will feature local 
talent giving their “ Living 
Proof' witness in song. Gerald 
Shanks of Muleshoe will be in 
charge of the music services and 
Mrs. Wendell Speck and Mrs. 
Charles Bratcher will be instru­
mentalists.
For the convenience of parents 

of small children, the nursery 
will be open for babies and very 
small children.

Rev. Evetts commented, "This 
is, perhaps, the first time many 
of our Muleshoe residents will 
hear these local pastors and 
singers. We, at Trinity, are 
excited about Good News Texas 
and are expected really great 
inspirational services.”

Hobby...
Cont. from Page 1

sell for 75 cents to $1.25 in 
fishing supply stores in Colora­
do. However, Edmiston's 
friends get a bonus, as he not 
only makes his flies for his own 
use, but keeps his friends 
supplied.
An employee of Muleshoe 

Motor Co. for the past 31 years, 
Edmiston wouldn't commit him­
self as to whether or not he will 
go into the professional fly tying 
business when he eventually 
retires. However, he does plan 
to keep making his famous flies, 
which have been proven to 
work, and keep supplying his 
friends, and anytime Edd Ed­
miston comes home from a 
fishing trip, you can be sure 
that he has his limit of Rainbow, 
German Brown, Cutthroat or 
Brook Trout.

First Baptist Will 
Host Guest Speaker

L.E. (CHIEF) LAWSON 
* * * *

If you fail the first 
time, and make no cor­
rection  for m istakes, 
there 's no reason why you 
shouldn't fail the second 
time.

Good News Texas revival ser­
vices will begin Sunday mor­
ning, April 17, in the First 
Baptist Church of Muleshoe. 
The church is one of the 
Southern Baptist Churches 
which is sharing "Living Proof" 
testimonies of notable people on 
television and radio, revealing 
that their lives are living proof 
that Jesus Christ is alive and 
can give peace of mind and 
purpose for life, said the pastor, 
J.E. Meeks. People in Muleshoe 
and the area are hearing the 
testimonies of: Oscar Mayer, 
Jeanne C. Riley, Connie Smith, 
Bill "White Shoes” Johnson, 
Dean Jones and others. These 
testimonies are being presented 
to help people overcome the 
number one problem of life - the 
problem of trying to live life 
without Jesus Christ, he added.

In conjunction with the "Living 
P roof testimonies and publici­
ty, the church will be in revival 
services April 17-24. The Good 
News of Jesus Christ will be 
shared in the services by an 
outstanding evangelistic team, 
said the minister.
The evanglist for the Good 

News Texas Revival is L.E. 
"Chief" Lawson, Director of the 
Department of Evangelism for 
the state of New Mexico. He 
was director of evangelism in 
the state of Indiana for Southern 
Baptists before coming to New 
Mexico. Lawson was born in 
Amarillo, Texas.
He graduated from high school 

in Alamogordo, New Mexico. 
He is a graduate of Hardin-Sim- 
mons University, Abilene, Tex­
as and Southwestern Baptist 
Theological Seminary in Fort

(f&'ll tom
dr

Ml Day Friday

" N e w "  Fish f r y
Cod Fillet, Cole Slaw,
Hush Puppies & Fries

All Yob  Cb b  E a t

S I ”

X X T
jfc STEAK HOUSE **

BIG CATCH . . . Edd Edmiston shows a 21 inch rainbow trout he 
caught with “ Old Faithful” a trout fly made by him. The large trout 
is only one of many he has caught using Old Faithful.

OPEN 24 
HOURS

SHOPILLSUP'S 
FOR FAMILY 
FAVORITES

ALLSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

OPEN 24 
HOURS

PRICES GOOD THURSDAY 
THRU SATURDAY. 

APRIL 14-16.1977

HYLAND CLUB
$2 ^ 9COFFEE

ALL BUNDS
1 LB. 
C M

CRISC0-,.............................51.59
32 OZj6 B a»t  BOTTLE CTN

COKES £ ........................... $1.29
w ii s o n s ’ EYe"  o r  m g

FRANKS................ !?..9f............
■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■

FREE ICEE!
BUY ONE ANY SIZE 

GET ONE SAME SIZE FREE!

ARMOUR^
0 i

12 0Z.
VAC P IC

FROSTY POPS
H 9 9 IBORDEN’S 0

2 4  CT. 
BOR

SPECIAL GROCERY SAVINGS

HI HO CRACKERS
69c

HOT COOKED FOODS

• BBQ CHICKEN • BBQ RIBS
• HOT LINKS • MILD LINKS
• BURRITOS •CORN DOGS 

•GERMAN SAUSAGE •BULK BBQ BEEF
• BBQ BEEF SANDWICHES
SHOP THE FRIENDLY. CONVENIENT 

ALLSUP S STORE NEAR YOU!

SUNSHINE

11B. 
BOX

HYDBOX COOKIES
SUNSHINE 

VANILLA ON 
CHOCOLATE 79

POTATO CHIPS

THIK CHIPS
GREENS 

REAL
7’/i OZ 

CAN 69c
414 W. AMERICAN BLVD.

Worth, Texas.
"As an evangelist "C hief’ 

Lawson is greatly appreciated 
among Southern Baptists. He 
has been used as an evangelist 
in twelve states and has repre­
sented the Home Mission Board 
of Southern Baptists in crusades 
in Canada, New Zealand, Aus­
tralia, Hong Kong, and at the 
Baptist World Alliance in Tok­
yo, Japan," added the minister. 

Music evangelist for the Good 
News Texas Revival services 
will be: Bill Sky-Eagle. He 
received his education at Baylor 
University and Southwestern 
Baptist Theological Seminary. 
Prior to entering the ministry of 
Full-time Music Evangelism in 
1973, he served seven years on 
staffs of Southern Baptist 
churches.

Bill Sky-Eagle and his wife Ivy 
Jean have served as Crusade 
Musicians in over 250 revivals 
and crusades. Bill has been 
soloist for the Texas Baptist 
Evangelism Conference, the 
Texas WMU Convention, and 
the Southern Baptist Conven­
tion.
The Good News Texas revival 

services will be April 17-24 at 
First Baptist Church. The Sun­
day services will be at 11:00 
a.m. and 7:00 p.m.
There will be noon day services 

at 12:00. The noon day services 
will be held in the; Fellowship 
Hall of the church. A lunch will 
be served each day, Monday 
through Friday, by the Hospita­
lity Committee of the church at 
no cost to those attending. The 
noon day service will be termi­
nated each day by 12:50 p.m. 
Week night services at 7:30 
p.m.

core...
Cont. from Page I 

begin June 1.
Board members were asked to 

review the CofC by laws and 
suggest any potential changes, 
which will be taken to the 
membership for approval on the 
next Chamber breakfast on May 
19.
Also discussed were last year’s 

Fourth of July fireworks. Board 
members will visit local busi­
nesses and ask them to help 
underwrite expenses of the fire­
works. They will also pass the 
hat at the fireworks for contribu­
tions to help take some of the 
burden off the local merchants, 
explained Black.
Citizen input is asked for the 

upcoming County Fair, which 
will be on the courthouse lawn 
in conjunction with the July 4th 
celebration. Booths will be a- 
vailable on a first-come, first- 
serve basis. ai)d organizations 
planning booths are asked to 
avoid duplication of other 
booths as much as possible. For 
reservation for booth space, 
contact the Chamber of Com­
merce office in the city hall or 
call 272-4248.

An upcoming seminar to be 
conducted by the Small Busi­
ness Association is in the plan­
ning stages at this time, with 
two subjects being considered. 
One is record keeping and the 
other is advertising. Black has 
recommended the seminar on 
advertising be conducted first.

Black also told board members 
a newsletter, outlining upcom­
ing activities is ready for the 
printer and will be in the mail 
next week.
Also planned is a weekly 

calendar of events, which will 
outline all club meetings and 
special events for Muleshoe on a 
week to week basis. An activi­
ties calendar will also be placed 
in the local motels for the 
benefit of travelers.

In final reports, discussed was 
the upcoming membership 
drive, which will be conducted 
April 19-21, and directed by 
board member Ed Cox and the 
upcoming annual meeting of the 
Muleshoe Area Industrial Foun­
dation.

Couple

€
D A L L A S

Air conditioned rooms with combma 
tion tub/shower, radio and color TV 
Swimming pool. Kitchenettes. Excel 
lent food by Chef Wittlich, featuring 
East Texas cornbread made daily. 
Convenient to Love Field, Cowboy 
Stadium and all Freeways

And remember, "Fred wants to sec
you."'

11230 Harry Hines B!vd (? ?  Business) 
••His Texas T5220 

»rti Code 714 Fleetwood 1 3711

BEER, MARIJUANA CONFISCATED . . .  Muleshoe City officer Fabian Flores, left; Sudan City Marshal 
Lanny Ross, center, and Muleshoe City Officer Forrist Williams look over beer, marijuana and other 
items confiscated from a wrecked vehicle Saturday night. The driver and three passengers were jailed on 
various charges following a police chase and wreck.

Wrecks...
Cont. from Page 1 

presstime.
Officers took a large amount of 

beer and a smaller amount of 
marijuana from the wrecked 
vehicle.

Early Sunday morning, ano­
ther wreck marred the Easter 
weekend. A nurse from West 
Plains Medical Center notified 
the Law Enforcement Center 
that a wreck victim had been 
brought in with possible serious 
back injuries.

Storm...
Cont. from Page I
ing weather nears this area. 
Operation is very simple. At 

the time a tornado or severe 
wind or a hailstorm is approach­
ing the information is relayed to 
the disaster control center in 
Muleshoe and then passed on to 
the radio station. If they have 
already gone off the air. the 
station is immediately re-op­
ened and the station transmits a 
sound that activates the Storm 
Sentry receiver. A voice com­
munication then givej you spe­
cific information and instruc­
tions of what to do for your 
safety, all within seconds.
The receivers are then shut off 

and are ready immediately for 
re-use. They are silent until the 
call is made. The system is 
handy and there is never any 
noise or interference until ne­
cessary to warn local citizens of 
approaching severe weather. 

Kiwanis members are current­
ly selling the systems at a 
reduced price and will make no 
profit on the transaction. They 
just want everyone to be per­
sonally prepared for potential 
disaster. It’s good insurance, 
it’s cheap insurance, and you 
will own the system, to use 
anywhere.

Another feature. The system is 
in use in many cities through 
designated radio stations. In the 
event you should move, or be 
visiting out of town, your com­
pact system is small enough to 
take right along with you in your 
suitcase and be ready by adjust­
ing the simple knobs to the 
designated stations.
FREE AT LAST

BIRMINGHAM, ALA. - 
Ben Pickens is completely 
free, 40 years after he stole 
$1,184. But he says he’s not 
angry over his years in prison. 
He and two other men robbed 
the Bank of Waterloo in Lau­
derdale County and kidnaped 
the bank president in 1936. He 
was sentenced to life imprison­
ment.

A late model pickup driven by 
Larry Ross, and occupied by 
John Street was traveling south 
of Muleshoe on Highway 214 
when Ross lost control after 
going off the roadway on the 
right side of the road. He 
apparently overcorrected, lost 
control and went into a broad­
side skid which ended with the 
pickup overturning. 

Investigating officer Ray Can­
non of the Texas Department of 
Public Safety from Littlefield, 
said the pickup did not com­
pletely overturn, as it was 
stopped by a tree. The back of 
the pickup was twisted around 
the trunk of the tree.

Ross walked to the Norman 
Head home north of the accident 
and Head took Street to the 
hospital. He was hospitalized 
for treatment of his injuries. 
Ross was uninjured in the 
accident, which totally demol­
ished his vehicle.

By the time officers were 
wrapping up the investigation of 
that accident, another call was 
received at the Law Enforce­
ment Center. John ried of 
John's Custom Mill reported 
that someone had entered his 
establishment and had stolen 
two new saddles.
The intruders had broken glass 

from a door and had entered the 
building, taking two new sad­
dles from a display in the 
building. Investigating officers 
were Sheriff Dee Clements, 
Deputy Pete Black and City 
Officer Forrist Williams. Johnny 
Fried went to the back of the 
building to check to see if the 
intruders had attempted entry 
there, and found the saddles 
hidden in the back.
Found approximately one-half 

block south of the business was 
a jacket belonging to Fried.

During the past week, several 
other offense reports were made 
at the Bailey County Law En­
forcement Center.
Included were a report by 

Kelly Joe Barnett of a stolen 
mattress and air conditioner and 
a missing whiteface heifer calf 
by Mrs. E.N. McCall.

Also, a missing floor jack from 
Johnnie's Shamrock and a CB

antenna stolen from a car at a 
local church.
Two shooting incidents were 

included in vandalism reports, 
with Wooley-Hurst reporting a 
windshield shot out of a tractor 
and Joe Wheeler at Enochs 
reported that someone shot a 
cow and a bull.

Arrests during the past week 
include six persons charged 
with being drunk; one for em­
bezzlement; one for assault; two 
for driving while intoxicated; 
one for driving while intoxicated 
and driving without a license 
and one for possession of mari­
juana.
Also, one for no driver's li­

cense; two for felony theft; one 
for minor possession (of liquor) 
and no driver's license; one for 
driving while intoxicated, con­
tributing to the delinquency of a 
minor and possession of mari­
juana.

And, one for drunk and resist­
ing arrest; one for contributing 
to the delinquency of a minor 
and possession of marijuana and 
one for minor possession of 
liquor and possession of mari­
juana.
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PLANT A WINNER!

5514
Here is the proof of 5514’s top yielding performance.

1976 Official Texas State Yield Trials*
Conducted by Texas A & M  University, T .A .E .S .

5514 was atop yielding hybrid in its maturity class 
at these locations:

55 1 4 ’s %
L ocation __________ Y ie ld /a c re  of te s t  a v e ra g e

Etter 7,803 lbs. 108.6
Lubbock 5,744 lbs. 103.7
San Angelo 3,593 lbs. 103.0
Temple 4,255 lbs. 106.2
Uvalde 5,449 lbs. 108.8
5 Test Average 5,368.8 lbs. 106.4

•Complete results upon request.

FOR MORE INFORMATION, CONTACT YOUR LOCAL P-A-G DEALER.

Ask your  P-A-G Dealer abou t the 1977 R E B A T E  P R O G R A M  
I t  w i l l  save you money on your  P -A -G  pu rch a se s  
P-A-G SEEDS, BOX 10303, LUBBOCK, TEXAS 79408
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OUTSTANDING YOUNG WOMEN . . . Mrs. Monty Dollar (right) 
and Mrs. John Birdwcll (left) have been selected by the Epsilon Chi 
chapter of F..S.A. sorority to be the recipients of the Outstanding 
Young Woman Award. Mrs. Dollar has been recognized for her 
work as director of the United Methodist Children's Center and in 
her sororoity. Beta Sigma Phi. Mrs. Birdwell has been recognized 
for her work as an active member in F..S. A. and is currently reigning 
as the beauty queen locally and at the district level in E.S.A. They 
will be formally recognized at the Annual Mother-Daughter 
Banquet to be held Mav 7, at the Colonia Park Country Club, Clovis, 
N.M.

beaten eggs to flour mixture. 
Beat hard for 2 minutes. Add 
remaining banana and vanilla. 
Beat for I minute. Pour into a 
greased 9 inch square pan and 
bake in an oven (375 degrees) 
for 25 minutes. Cool on cake 
rack. Frost with banana frost-

RECIPE
Bananas are the star in­

gredient in each of these reci­
pes. As everyone knows, fully 
ripe bananas are deep yellow 
with flecks of brown.

Banana Cake 
2'/« c cake flour 
1% c sugar 
2‘/i t baking powder 

'/« t baking soda 
'/< t salt
•A c butter or margarine 

l'/i c mashed ripe bananas 
2 eggs 
1 t vanilla

Sift the flour, sugar, bak­
ing pov der, salt, and baking 
soda together in a bowl. Be 
sure butter is softened. Add 
butter, '/i c banana and un

ing.
Banana Frosting

’/« c sugar 
1 egg white 

'/j banana mashed 
1 t vanilla

Mix sugar and egg white in 
top of double boiler. Cook over 
hot water beating with egg 
beater until frosting holds its 
shape. Mix in mashed banana 
and vanilla. Beat several min­
utes longer. Remove from heat 
and cool before putting on 
cake.

West Plains 
Medical 

|enter_Briefs!
ADMISSIONS
April 7 - Mrs. Phyllis Coburn 

and Mrs. Geneva Lemons.
April 8 - Shannon Massengale, 

Rammie Garner. Jeff Sliger, 
Mrs. Blanche Cash, Mrs. Pearl 
Killingsworth and Charlie D 
Hoover.

April 10- John Street and Mrs, 
Frances Jennings.
April 11 - Thurman Bartlett 

and J.C. Gatewood. 
DISMISSALS
April 8 - Thurman Bartlett, 

Mrs. Dianne Allison, Mrs. 
Clemmie Ladd, Mrs. Beverly Jo 
Wagnon, Mrs. Olene Watts, 
Efren Agundis, Freddie Gay-

Leathercraft 
Club Starts 
New Projects
The Progress 4-H Leathercraft 

Club met for its first project 
meeting Wednesday, March 30, 
at the West Camp Community 
Center.

Leaders, Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Hunt, and Junior leaders, Greg 
Harrison, Sheila Hunt and Cur­
tis Hunt, helped project mem­
bers with pattern placement and 
tooling of belts, billfolds, coast­
ers and purses.

Members attending were Tom­
my and Curtis Wheeler, Jason 
and Preston Scoggins, Johnny 
and Connie Puckett, Monti and 
Trent Hysinger, Paula Snell, 
Betsy Lunsford, Dana and Jim 
Holmes, Sharia Morrison, La- 
von Rhodes and Tori Hunt.

Chill a gelatin salad mixture in 
scalloped orange shells, saved 
from the morning juice-making.

nard and Mrs. Kay Lynn Gallo­
way and baby girl.

April 9 • Jeff Sliger, Shelly 
Berry, F..R. Wall, Rammie Gar­
ner. Shannon Massengale and 
Mrs. Blanche Cash.
April 10 - Phyllis Coburn and 

baby girl and Mrs. Pearl Kil­
lingsworth.

April II - Mrs. Frances Jen­
nings and baby girl and Louise 
Favor.

Patent &
l y V /  i  N o n  P a l n 1 ^  * n

2 (,al Container &
'  Ready To Bloom.

Hybrid Teas, Floribundas, 
Climbers & Crandi Floras

We Have A New Arrival Of Trees 
* & Shrubs.

Bedding Plants AvaHabit

2>ec6wtou 2 1 6
616 S. 1st 2 7 2 -4 3 4 0

Xe,°AsV «
t t V %

«  6 o  *  r <r *

V  o
c .
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is hardLife is hard to 

who make it hard.
those
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A people ready to share
[SouthemBaptists in Texas want to share 

their l iv in g  P roo f with you.
iTrii!iW Bfli't'isV Ch'yriil" First BoP,is* ChB"h Ph' 272'4224
T Pli*272-3301 h Templo Bautista Mission Ph.272-4893

Hurst Couple 
Exchange Vows

Carson  Lloyd Camp
Mr. and Mrs. Robert C. Camp 

of Schaumburg, Illinois are the 
proud parents of a new baby boy 
born March 27, at the Lutheran 
General Hospital in Park Ridge, 
Illinois. The baby weighed sev­
en pounds and fifteen ounces 
and was named Carson Lloyd 
Camp. The couple has one other 
son, Cabell.

Paternal grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Bernis Camp of Mule- 
shoe and maternal grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd L. 
Turner of Hyden. Kentucky.

M • li nd a Ka y  Coburn

Mr. and Mrs. Travis Coburn of 
Farwell arc the proud parents of 
a new baby girl born April 8 at 
2:46 p.m. in West Plains Medi­
cal Center. The baby weighed 
five pounds and six ounces and 
was named Melinda Kay Co­
burn. The couple has one other 
child, Travis Brian.

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. E.L. Robinson of 
Texico, N.M., and paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
T.M. Coburn, Sr., of Estancia, 
N.M.

Apr i l  Dawn  Jenning s

Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Loyd 
Jennings of Morton are the 
proud parents of a new baby girl 
born April 10, at 10:46 a.m. in 
West Plains Medical Center. 
The baby weighed five pounds 
and six ounces and was named 
April Dawn Jennings. She is the 
couple’s third child.

Vows were exchanged in Hurst 
by Miss Deanna Sue Dillingham 
and Delmer Dee Bleeker. The 
couple was married Saturday. 
April 9, in a garden wedding at 
the future home of the couple. 
The Rev. Henry Elder Redwine 
officiated at the service.

Parents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. William Broughman of 
Hurst and Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Bleeker of Muleshoe.
Serving the bride as her atten­

dants were Miss Mary Brough­
man and Miss Bonnie Brough­
man, sisters of the bride, and 
Miss Kathy Davidson. Miss 
Donna Horn and Miss Kathy 
Horn, nieces of the groom, 
served as flowergirls.

Family Night 
Set For April 16 
At West Camp

The West Camp community 
residents will hold their monthly 
Family Night Saturday, April 
16. at 7:30 p.m. in the communi­
ty center.

Host couples for the night will 
be Mr. and Mrs. C.E. Grant and 
Mr. and Mrs. Darrell Stephens. 
They will be in charge of the 
evening's activities planned. A- 
dult table games, ping-pong, 
pool, children's table games and 
visiting have been planned.

Each family is to bring cookies, 
cake or pie for refreshments. 
The coffee and punch will be 
furnished.

• * * *
In spring there 's noth­

ing pretter than spring.

Chuck Proctor, Harry Sweatzer 
and Michael Owen, cousin of 
the groom, served as attendants 
to the bridegroom. Johnny Horn 
and Michael Mann, nephews of 
the groom, served as ring 
bearers.
The couple will travel to Hous­

ton and the surrounding area 
before making their home at 101 
West Cheryl, Hurst.
Out-of-town guests were Mr, 

and Mrs. Vernon Bleeker, 
Muleshoe; Mrs. Joe Bob Mann, 
Michael and Steven, Friona; 
Mr. and Mrs. Max Horn and 
children, Houston; and Mr. and 
Mrs. Alford Bleeker. Belaire.

* * * *
Indira Gandhi, defeated 

Indian Prime Minister: 
“ The collective judg­

ment of the people must 
be re sp e c te d . My col­
leagues and I accept their 
verdict.”

Arthur Burns, Federal Re­
se rve Board C h a ir­
man, on rebates: 
"Economists are cor­

rupting you in Congress 
and you in Congress are 
corrupting the rest of the 
country.”

Jim m y Carter, President: 
‘‘The U nited S tates 

will resume negotiations 
without preconditions or 
delay to establish friend­
ship and normal relations 
with Hanoi.”

Alpha Zeta Pi Installs 
Officers, New Members

Troop 417 met Tuesday, April 
4, with 10 girls present.
The girls worked on their 

Mother's Day gifts. Carolyn 
Hodges served as “ Keeper ot 
Gold" and Heather Merritt read 
the promise.

Mrs. Pena Lopez and Rosa 
served refreshments.

Alpha Zeta Pi chapter of Beta 
Sigma Phi met Tuesday, April 5, 
in the home of Mrs. Mike Miller 
with the membership committee 
serving as co-hostess.

Mrs. Miller conducted the 
Ritual of Jewels ceremony for 
Mrs. Mark Gist, Mrs. Terry 
Hill. Mrs. Homer Allgood, and 
Mrs. Gary Renner. To qualify 
for the Ritual of Jewels Degree, 
these pledges completed the 
pledge training and passed a 
test which included general 
information on Beta Sigma Phi.
Installation of officers was 

conducted by outgoing presi­
dent, Mrs. Monty Dollar. The 
hew officers are President Mrs. 
Tommy Merritt; Vice President 
Mrs. Tim Foster; Recording 
Secretary Mrs. Tommy Little; 
Corresponding Secretary Mrs. 
Steve Black; Extension Officer 
Mrs. Alec Schuster; and Trea­
surer Mrs. Dave Marr.
The business meeting was 

conducted by Mrs. Monty Doll­
ar. president. Mrs. Tim Foster 
passed out sheets setting up 
committees for Founder’s Day, 
which will be held April 30 at 
the Muleshoe Country Club at 
7:30 p.m. This is an annual 
event held in conjunction with 
Xi Omicron Xi. Mrs. Tommy 
Merritt presented to the group a 
plaque which was given to

Patterns
w i th  a

WESTERN Flair

SIZE 
2 T014 
*2  50

Alpha Zeta Pi for their help in 
sponsoring a Girl Scout troop. 
Other business discussed was 

Mother's Day which is also an 
annaul event held in conjunction 
with Xi Omicron Xi. This will be 
held Saturday, May 7.
Members attending were Mrs. 

Tommy Black, Mrs. Dick Chit­
wood, Mrs. Kick Halford, Mrs. 
Monty Dollar, Mrs. Tim Foster, 
Mrs. Skip Magby, Mrs. Dave 
Marr, Mrs. Tommy Merritt, 
Mrs. Mike Miller, Mrs. Danny 
Noble, Mrs. Gary Toombs, Mrs. 
Paul Wilbanks, Mrs. Alec 
Schuster, Mrs. Homer Allgood, 
Mrs. Mark Gist, Mrs. Terry Hill 

and Mrs. Gary Renner.

Friendship Club 
Holds Meeting

The Friendship Club met in the 
XIT Steakhouse dining hall 
Thursday, April 7, with Mrs. 
Joe Damron and Mrs. Blondie 
Ray as hostesses.
Mrs. Bert Mathis gave the 

invocation. The meeting was 
presided over by Mrs. Gladys 
Darsey, president. The minutes 
of the last meeting were read by 
Mrs. Jewell Griffiths. Mrs. 
J.W. Witherspoon gave the 
financial report.

Mrs. Katherine Cole presented 
the program by giving a review 
on the “ Life of Helen Keller".

Members present were Mrs. 
W.T. Andrews, Mrs. Gladys 
Darsey, Mrs. S.M. Ethridge, 
Mrs. Jewell Griffiths, Mrs. Ed 
Johnson, Mrs. George Johnson. 
Mrs. Bert Mathis, Mrs. N.C. 
Moore, Mrs. J.B. Smith, Mrs. 
Scott Swafford, Mrs. J.W. 
Witherspoon, Mrs. Mary 
Young, Mrs. W.E. Young. Mrs. 
Viola Layne, Mrs. Blondie Rhy, 
Mrs. Joe Damron, Mrs. Kather­
ine Cole and one visitor, Mrs. 
R.L. Hobbs.
The next meeting will be held 

Thursday, May 5, with Mrs. 
N.C. Moore and Mrs. Arthur 
Shafer as hostesses.

* * * *
The movie "O scars” 

prove very little.

MRS. DELMER DEE BLEEKER

X i  Omiaen, X i  <?1&M

Xi Omicron Xi chapter of Beta 
Sigma Phi met Tuesday, April 5, 
in the home of Mrs. John Neil 
Agee. Mrs. Doyce Turner serv­
ed as co-hostess.
The business meeting was 

conducted by Mrs. Charles 
Pummill. Officer and committee 
reports were given. Prepara­
tions are being made for the 
Founder’s Day Banquet, to be 
held April 30 and the Mother's 
Day Luncheon to be held May 7. 
Mrs. Marcia Henry has been 
assigned chairman of the activi­
ties. She assigned committees 
to work with Alpha Zeta Pi on 
preparations.
The program was given by 

Mrs. Ken Box and Mrs. Bob 
Finney. The name of the pro­
gram, "Change -  Tomorrow's 
Dawn" had each member as­
signed to a group depicting the 
I940's - 1970’s. Caching group 
dressed accoridng to their as­
signed year. They did a com­

mercial on some type of product 
that was popular that year. 
Members summarized how fa­
shions and products have 
changed in the last 40 years.
The hostesses served raw veg­

etables with shrimp dip and 
crackers, strawberry pie, punch, 
coffee and soft drinks. Members 
present were Mrs. Spencer 
Tanksley, Mrs. Charles Pum­
mill, Mrs. Max King, Mrs. 
Marcia Henry, Mrs. Doyce Tur­
ner. Mrs. John Agee. Mrs. Ker 
Box, Mrs. Bob Finney and Mrs 
Joe King.

Try adding some crushed pine- 
• applc to creamed chicken or 
turkey for an unusual flavor. Or 
spread creamyd chicken or tur­
key in a greased casserole, 
cover or border the top with 
leftover cornbread or chicken 
flavor stuffing mix and brow n in 
a hot oven.

Senior Dance 
April 15 At 

Bamert Farm
A Barn Dance will be held on 

Friday, April 15, from 9:00 
p.m. until midnight for the 
Senior class, their dates and 
sponsors at the Carl Bamert 
Farm.
The Mesquites, a band from 

Clovis, N.M., will present 
entertainment for the night.
Sponsoring the dance are 

Mr. and Mrs. Carl Bamert, 
Mr. and Mrs. R.D. (Tub) 
Angeley, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Gunter and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Martin.
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Those playing ’42’ Tuesday 
were Walter Damron. Mae Wil- 
terding. Onie McDaniel, Betty 
Jackson, Arthur Perkins, Rosie 
McKillip and Connor Burford.

• • •  • •
Rev. James Williams of the 

Calvary Baptist Church put on a 
program Sunday afternoon. He 
sang songs and brought a 
devotional.

Mr. and Mrs. Alton Garth 
visited his sister. Mrs. Onie 
McDaniel, Sunday.

• • • * *
James Boydstun, Ralls, N.M., 

visited his mother, Mrs. Carrie 
Boydstun, Sunday and other 
visitors were Mrs. Hoover and 
Opal Talley.

Mrs. Beulah Harper visited her 
children Sunday.

• * • • •
Quinn Weaver visited his wife, 

Mrs. Clara Weaver Sunday.
• • • • •

Mrs. Guinn has been enjoying 
a visit from her daughter, Mrs. 
Margaret Holt, for a few days. 
She is from Brown wood.

* • •  * •
Mrs. Kersey spent the after­

noon with Mrs. Guinn Sunday.' 
• * * * •

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Gregory 
and children visited Mrs. Guinn 
Sunday.

*** * *
Bernice Bray and wife visited 

Mrs. Bray and Mrs. Blackburn 
over the weekend. They are 
from Dallas.

Larry Dunham Elected 
Vice President To Bank

Mrs. Inez Sanders of Morton 
and Mrs. Gladys Phillips of 
Needmore visited their mother, 
Mrs. Mary Hardin. Wednesday. 

* * * *
T h i n k i n g  u s u a l l y  

means less talking.

LOUISA’S
LETTER

Dear Louisa,
1 am a college freshman 

and 1 attend a school which is 
about one hundred miles from 
my home town. 1 have been 
very lonesome since coming 
here as all these students are 
strangers to me.

But the person who has 
been really friendly to me is a 
lovely girl who works as a 
waitress in the cafe in which I 
eat my dinners. She is a 
perfect lady and we have had a 
number of dates together. 
There is only one thing that 
worries me. She never lets me 
take her home and I have 
never met any of her family. 
Why would she act this way?

Troubled-Pa.
Answer:

There may be a number of 
reasons why she is reluctant to

GOLDEN GLEAMS
Memory is the treasury 

and guardian of all 
things.

-Cicero.

The palest ink is better 
than the best memory.

-Chinese Proverb.

Of all the faculties of the 
human mind memory 
is the first that flour­
ishes, and the first

Elected Vice President and 
Cashier at the March meeting ot 
the Board of Directors of Friend­
ly National Bank of Oklahoma 
City, Okla., was Larry Dunham. 
He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 

R.P. Dunham of Muskogee, 
Okla. Dunham graduated from 
Muleshoe High School. He has a 
B.S. Degree from Northeastern

West Camp 
Coffee Break 
April 15
The West Camp community 

residents will have a community 
coffee break on Friday morning, 
April 15, at 10:00 a.m. in the 
community center.
A former judge for the Com­

munity Improvement program 
will be the guest. He will give 
information for entertaining the 
judges of their record book later 
this month.

State College and School for 
Bank Administration.

Dunham had been employed 
by Central National Bank for the 
past 11 years. He is a member of 
the Board of Directors of Trav­
elers Aid Society.

He is married to Mrs. Iris 
Dunham and they have one 
daughter, Terry Deanna. 

*****
Dribs and drabs of leftover 

vegetables can reappear suc­
cessfully in a salad, plain or 
jellied, or combined in a cream 
of mushroom soup sauce, sprin­
kled with cheese or crumbs and 
oven browned.
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Living Willi ( l i a n a s  In The 
Family Focus Of Seminar

LARRY DUNHAM

Epsilon Sigma Alpha To 
Sponsor Dog Show April 23

introduce you to her folks. 
Perhaps she feels that you 
come from a family of more 
education and from one who 
have more material things 
than her family has. This is 
nothing to be ashamed of, if 
her folks are good, respectable 
people, but it does make a 
difference with some young 
people.

On the other hand she may 
have a member of the family 
who gets drunk and she never 
knows what to expect when 
she reaches home.

Why not ask her why she 
acts the way she does and let 
her know that your friendship 
doesn't depend on family 
wealth or status.

Louisa.
Address letters: Louisa, Box 
532, Orangeburg, S.C. 29115

that dies.
-C.C. Colton.

The memory strengthens 
as you lay budens 
upon it, and becomes 
tru stw o rth y  as you 
trust it.

-Thomas De Quincey.

How cruelly sweet are the 
echoes that start 

When memory plays an 
old tune on the heart.

-Eliza Cook.

Almost any vegetable can be 
cooked, quickly cooled and then 
refrigerated, to turn up later in a 
casserole, as a Filling for baked 
tomatoes or green peppers, or in 
soups.

Shonda Strahan, 
Collin Robison 
Ho noredApril 2

A birthday party honored Miss 
Shonda Strahan and Collin Rob­
ison Saturday, April 2. Miss 
Strahan is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Gary Strahan. Robison 
is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Wendell Robison.

Miss Strahan's cake was pink 
and white decorated with pink 
candles and bunny rabbits. A 
white bunny with a red bow tie 
decorated with gum drops and 
red candles served as Robison's 
cake. Games were played by all 
who attended.

Miss Strahan was five on April 
10 and Robison was four on 
April 4.
Those present were Dayne 

Hamilton, Chad Schroeder, Jen­
nifer Guinn. Shannon Gregory, 
Krystal Derrick, Chantel Robi­
son, Mrs. Wayne Gregory and 
Brandon, Mrs. Eddie Derrick 
and Kandle, Mrs. Bill Noffsker, 
Mrs. L.M. Hardage. Mrs. Syl­
van Robison, Mrs. Lee Mason. 
Mrs. Don Strahan, Mrs. Gary 
Strahan and Mr. and Mrs. 
Wendell Robison.

The E.S.A. sorority in Mule­
shoe has set Saturday, April 23, 
as the date for the Spring Dog 
Show. The site for the show will 
be the ball diamond adjacent to 
K.M.U.L. radio station on West 
Eighth Street. The show will 
begin at 9:30 a.m. and will run 
until all categories have been 
judged.

The entry fee per class entered 
will be $1.00 for everyone. 
Ribbons will be awarded to the 
first, second and third place 
winners in each category. Ro­
sette ribbons will be presented 
to the Reserve and Grand 
Champion winners of the show.
There will be an adult and a 

children's division for the show. 
The categories in the adult 
division are: Large hunting dog; 
small hunting dog; large work­
ing dog; small working dog and 
groomed dogs (poodles, Pomer­
anian, Afhan hounds, etc.).

The children's division will 
have the following categories: 
most original costume; shortest 
ears, smallest dog; best trained 
dog; funniest costume; largest 
dog, dog with the most spots 
and dog with longest tail.
A concession stand will be 

available to the public attending 
the show until the show has 
been completed.
Anybody wishing to enter the 

show can contact Mrs. Hugh 
Young, 272-4738 or 272-3976, or 
Mrs. John Birdwell, 946-3321 or 
946-3380.
Dogs entered in the show must 

be on a leash at all times. When 
the entry fee is being paid, 
verification of inoculation of the 
entered dog must be presented 
or the dog will not be allowed to 
enter. The sorority will not be 
held responsible for any injuries 
and/or accidents to dogs and 
the public.

Muleshoe Pfaces In UIL Action
The district UIL contest was on 

April 2, 1977 in the Muleshoe 
Junior High classrooms. There 
were students in fourth through 
eighth grades from Olton, Little­
field, Dimmitt, Friona, and 
Muleshoe. This is the first yeai 
to compete against other towns 
in the UIL.
Brad Poynor won second plact 

in the seventh and eight gradi 
Ready Writing contest. Julius 
Briscoe won first place in the 
Number Sense. In the seventh 
and eighth grade Spelling and 
Plain Writing contest Lupe Ros­
ales won second place. In the 
Picture Memory, the team score 
for fourth and fifth grade won 
second. The team consisted ol 
Sherri Bessirc, Deidre McGee.

Susie Hyde, Suzanne Williams, 
and Traci Hutton. In the fifth 
and sixth grade Oral Reading. 
Carol Clark won first.

Muleshoe came out in second 
place with 60 points. Littlefield 
was first with 107. It was scored 
by giving 15 points to the first 
place, 10 points to the second 
place and five points to the third 
place winner. The scores were 
posted on a board in the library. 
We would like to congratulate 
these students on their winnings 
and their hard, dedicated work.

It's not always easy for a father 
to be content during the first 
year of a baby’s life in a 
supporting role to his wife and 
child.

"Although fathers are familiar 
figures to an infant, a real 
father-child relationship doesn't 
begin until the second year," 
says Mrs. Robin Taylor, County 
Extension agent.
The adjustments that a family 

makes as it undergoes changes 
during the early years will be 
the focus of five workshops 
during a seminar April 21 in 
Lubbock at St. John's United 
Methodist Church.
The seminar, which is from 10 

a.m. to 3 p.m., will feature a 
keynote address by noted psy­
chologist Dr. Frederick Mearsof 
Texas Eastern University at 
Tyler.

Registration begins at 9:30 
a.m. Fee for the four-hour 
program is $1 for adults, and no 
charge for high school students. 
Child-care facilities will be avai­
lable at a total cost of $2.50 for 
the first child, and $1 for each 
additional child.
The event is being sponsored 

by the Texas Agricultural Ex­
tension Service in cooperation 
with South Plains Development 
(SPD) Program's family living 
task force.
Mrs. Taylor, a co-hostess for 

the program, says the SPD task 
force and Extension Service, 
assisted by several Lubbock 
public service agencies includ­
ing the March of Dimes, is 
staging the program for the 
benefit of all area citizens. It is 
the first of a three-year empha­
sis on living with change within 
the family. Focus this year is on 
the early years. Next year, the 
seminar will deal with the 
middle years, and the third year 
will center on living with chang­
es during the family’s later 
years.

"One of the workshops this 
April 21, will emphasize adjust­
ing to changes associated with 
interpersonal relationships and 
on how a person views oneself. 

“ A second session will outline 
the changes one encounters 
upon entering marriage, such as 
developing inlaw relationships. 
Many couples,” she adds, "en­
joy pleasant, satisfying relation­
ships with their inlaws but 
others are plagued by conflict 
and ill feelings. Researchers 
have found that certain factors

contribute heavily to a satisfying 
relationship.

“ In a third workshop, leaders 
will focus on stress changes 
associated with pregnancy. 
There are many motives for 
pregnancy. Some may even be 
selfish and immature," she 
adds.

"But if a couple learns to view 
their child as an individual 
being rather than an extension 
of their own egos, and can feel a 
loving concern for their child, 
the babv's birth can be a joyous 
event after all."

Mrs. Taylor says that how 
children learn will be a focus of 
attention of another workshop. 
Parents who compare their 
child's development to that of 
other children can be asking for 
frustration, she ads. How to 
avoid this kind of situation will 
be among the many ideas 
expressed during this session.

In the fifth workshop, the early 
years of marriage will be out­
lined. Open, honest communica­
tion, sharing feelings, and mu­
tual trust and respect are among 
the topics to be discussed.

"For most adults, a permanent 
and rewarding marriage is the 
most satisfying part of their 
lives,” she says. “ No one has 
yet found the exact combination 
of effort and promise or of 
personality and circumstance 
that lifts a couple and their 
marriage out of the ordinary. 
Some general threads weave

through most successful mar­
riages.”

In all of these workshops, the 
stress factor will be empha­
sized.
Participants will be able to 

attend any two of the five 
workshops. The keynote ad­
dress by Dr. Mears will precede 
these sessions, and he will also 
conclude the program.

"Coping with factors that lead 
to stress and frustration is a 
challenge every family faces 
daily," Mrs. Taylor says. "We 
believe these workshops, along 
with the expert, common-sense 
advice Dr. Mears is expected to 
offer, will be invaluable to every 
family.”

Speakers for the five work 
sessions are Mrs.Ilene Miller, 
family life education specialist 
with the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, College Sta­
tion; Phil Carpenter, marriage 
family counselor at Central 
Plains Mental Health Center 
Plainview; Mrs. Nel Loper, ex 
ecutive director for the National 
Foundation - March of Dimes 
Dr. Connie Steele, assistant 
professor - child development 
Texas Tech University, Lub 
bock; and Deborah Johnson 
family life education specialist 
Texas Agricultural Extension 
Service. College Station.

Mrs. Bobby Cohorn of Lamesa 
is program chairman. Mrs. Tom 
Box of Plains is task force 
chairman, and Mrs. Catherine 
B. Crawford, district agent for 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service at Lubbock, is 
coordinator.
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PRICES EFFECTIVE APRIL 14 -  16
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VEG-ALL

CORNING WARE
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J u n i o r  W o m a n ’s C l u b  
T o  P r e s e n t  A r t  S h o w
The Clovis Junior Women's 

Club will hold their Twentieth 
Annual Art Show Sunday, April 
17, from 1:00 p.m. to 4:30 p.m. 
at the Doc Stewart Chevrolet 
Center, 2500 Mabry Drive, Clo­
vis, N.M.

No entry fee or admission will 
be charged. Artists are allowed 
to enter two works of art. All

BIBLE VERSE
' ' F a t h e r ,  f o r g i v e  

them: fo r  they know not 
what they Jo. ''
1. Who made the above 
request?
2. Upon what occasion?
3. Who were " th ey "?
4. Where may his verse 
be found?

A n s w e r s  l o  B ib le  Ver se
1. Jesus.
2. As he hung on the 
cross on G olgotha.
3. The Roman soldiers, 
who crucified Him specifi­
cally, but generally to the 
Jewish leaders who had 
caused his death.
4. Luke 23:34.

paintings must be framed or 
matted. Paintings larger than 12 
inches by 16 inches must have a 
standing easel provided by the 
artist. Sculptures must be table 
size.

Exhibits will be received at the 
Doc Stewart Chevrolet Center 
on Sunday, April 17, from 8:30 
a.m. to li:30 a.m.

For additional information, call 
Mrs. Robert R. Harrison, Art 
Committee Chairman, at 505- 
762-4885.

* * * *
Most of the compli­

ments you hear aren’t to 
be taken seriously.

SERVING YOUR NEEDS FOR 23 YEARS

SALE $45
SILADIUM* CLASS RINGS

SAVE UPTO 20%

YOUR RING COSTS ONLY
$  J | £  WHEN YOU 

■  ^  BRING THIS AD!
LIMITEDTIMEONLY!

OFFER GOOD THROUGH MAY 15,1977

Now, for the first time you can 
get a beautiful Siladium ring for 
just $45. Siladium looks like 
white gold, but it's stronger 
And you get the greatest choice 
ever of custom features

JOHN ROBERTS
CLASS RINGS AT

JLidufi Cicdit
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202 Main
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272-3355
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UTILITY BOOTS
M583 Bronze Glove, 8" Hi-Cut
Welt Construction, Lined Vamp, 
Cookie Cushioned Insole, Natural 
Cushion Crepe Sole and Heel,
30 Iron Edge, Viking Last 
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COMET

CLEANSER
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•  l e m o n  fresh
•  BALSAM & BODY
•  WITH EXTRA BODY 
.  W ITH EXTRA CONDITIONERS
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Ready

To Share”C all 272-4224
First

BaptistChvrdi
Attend

GoodNews 
Texas Revival
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Lawson 

Evangelist
Music Director 
Bill Sky-Eagle
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Heel, 30 Iron Edge, Viking Last 
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Coupon Hoax Fails 
To Aid In Dialysis
A hoax promising free care for 

kidney patients has tricked 
thousands of people recently. 
People have been collecting the 
black striped computer labels 
off canned goods and other 
groceries in the false hope that 
somebody would pay for part ol 
a patient's treatment on a 
kidney dialysis machine for 
every label turned in.
The Texas Medical Association 

has been unable to find anyone 
who wants to redeem the labels. 
In fact, there is no need for such 
a collection program because 
Medicare and other tax-financ­
ed aid programs pay for a 
kidney patient's dialysis care. 
The state’s Medicaid program 
pays 100 percent of the cost for 
the first three months of care, 
and then the federal Medicare

program takes over by paying 80 
percent of the costs.

An official with the National 
Kidney Foundation in New York 
said this collection scheme is a 
common mistake. She said it 
usually occurs in the spring and 
people have collected almost 
everything imaginable, includ­
ing bottle caps and aluminum 
can tabs. A worker at the 
Kidney Foundation of Houston 
said she got several calls a day 
from people asking about the 
computer label scheme.
The rumor seems to spread on 

its own and well-meaning peo­
ple begin collecting the comput­
er labels. There are various 
stories that food companies, 
schools, churches, hospitals and 
patients themselves are taking 
the labels. The doctor of one 
such patient in East Texas said

his patient definitely was not 
collecting the labels and did not 
need to because federal aid paid 
for her treatments.

Kidney dialysis is an expensive 
treatment by a machine that 
removes the poisons from a 
patient's body when his own 
kidneys fail to do so. Some 
people have to be treated sever­
al hours a week. Often replacing 
the defective kidney is the only 
cure, but there is a shortage ol 
kidneys.

People can donate their kid­
neys after death and help save 
lives. For more information on 
donating kidneys, contact the 
Living Bank, 6681 South Main, 
Houston, Texas 77005; the Na­
tional Kidney Foundation. 116 
East 27th Street, New York, 
New York 10016; or the back of 
your 1977 Texas drivers license 
may have the information.

Career Man
First Prisoner-"What are 

you in for?”
Second Prisoner-"Want to 

be a warden, so 1 thought I'd 
start from the bottom."

Enochs News
By M rs . J.D. Bay l»ss

Mr. and Mrs. C.C. Snitker 
spent Tuesday night with his 
sister. Mr. and Mrs. Dewie 
Johnson at Roswell, N.M. Their 
son. Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Snit­
ker and family of Hart met them 
at Ruidoso, to spend the rest of 
the week.

• • * • *
Diane Crume of Temple spent 

last week with her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Edward Crume.

« • * * *
Mr. and Mrs. Quinton Nichols 

and sons did some fishing at 
Logan Lake during the Easter
holidays.

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Shaw and 
son of Post spent Saturday night 
and Sunday with his parents, 
Mr.a nd Mrs. Charlie Shaw.

* * • * *
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Layton 

and son drove to Lake Brown- 
wood Thursday where they did

some fishing. Jheir daughters, 
Mr. and Mrs. David McDaniel 
of Austin and Mr. and Mrs. 
Mark Darrington of Del Rio met 
them there.

* * * * *

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. J.D. Bayless Tuesday were 
Mr. and Mrs. F.L. Adair and 
Mrs. Gracy Swanner of Lub­
bock.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. Dale Nichols and 
daughter, Mrs. Flo Nichols and 
Gary, and Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Nichols did some fishing at 
Brokcnbow Lake in Oklahoma. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Snitker 

and daughters of Perryton spent 
Saturday night and Sunday with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. C.C. 
Snitker.

* * * * *

Edd Autry spent several days 
as a patient in the Littlefield 
Hospital the past week.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. Michel Autry are 
moving to Muleshoe.

Orbe Phillips was dismissed 
from the hospital in Portales, 
N.M. Wednesday.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. J.E. Layton and 
sons, and Carl Hall drove to 
Lubboc Sunday afternoon to 
attend a wedding anniversary 
for Mr. and Mrs. J.T. Burns. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Newton and 

their son and family of Stinnett 
did some fishing at Colorado
City.

* * * * *

Easter guests in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Johny Cox were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Angel and 
daughters, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Junior Austin and sons, all of 
Lubbock, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Nichols.

Mrs. J.W. Layton and Mrs. 
J.D. Bayless visited in the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. H.H. Snow at 
the Muleshoe Thursday after­
noon.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Snitker. 
Maribel, Robert and John did

some fishing at Lake Hubbard 
during the Easter holidays. 

* * ***
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Austin 

visited her brother, Mr. and 
Mrs. Clarence Moore, at Clovis 
last Saturday. Sunday they visit­
ed their daughter, the Orphus 
Tate family at Cotton Center. 

* * * * *
Mrs. F.G. Linsey of Fort Worth 

visited her parents, the L.G. 
Fred's, last week.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. Curtis Snitker 
and family of Hart, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ronnie Gilbert of Sudan 
and the Stanley Snitkers of Hart 
were all supper guests in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. C.C. 
Snitker Sunday night.

* * * * *

Mr. and Mrs. Junior Austin 
and Greg and Jeff of Lubbock 
visited his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Raymond Austin, Sunday 
afternoon.

* * * * *

Mrs. Ruby Nichols of Lubbock 
visited her sister, Mrs. Winnie 
Byars, Saturday. Rita Nichols 
and her friend also visited her.

Mr. and Mrs. E.N. McCall 
visited their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert George and family, 
and Mr and Mrs. Don Vanland- 
inuham and children Sunday.

*  *  *  »  •

Mr. and Mrs. L.G. Fred visited 
H.W. Garvin at the Morton 
hospital Sunday afternoon. 

*** * *
Mr and Mrs. Dennis Turney 

had as their guests Easter 
Sunday for a barbecue dinner 
his grandparents, her parents, 
her sister, his mother, and a lot 
of other relatives.

Michael. Kim and Russel Au­
try flew to Houston Wednesday 
to spend the Easter holidays 
with their father, John Autry. 

*****
Mrs. Earl Shields and daugh­

ter. Patrice and her girls friend 
of Lelia Lake spent the Easter 
Holidays with her mother, Mrs. 
Lorella Jones, and brother, 
Wendell.

Congress' hike in pay 
deplored.

'AL$!

When you buy three (3) 20-oz. Cans 
Piggly Wiggly Choice Chunk,Sliced,or

Crushed 
Pineapple
With this coupon.

Coupon expires April 16, 1977. ___

& PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 50c
When you buy one (1) 16-oz. Btl.

Welle Balsam 
Shampoo

With this coupon.
Coupon expires April 16, 1977.

'ii &  &  & &  &&&& S 3
PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE S IT
When you buy one (1) pair 

Piggly Wiggly Style No. 419

Knee-Hi 
Hose

With this coupon.
Coupon expires April 16, 1977.

ii & & & & & & & & & & & & & &
9 PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

3 Lbs. or More, Lean

Ground Beef
98c

Farmer Jones

Tasty Franks

79t12-oz.
Pkg.

Breast or Leg, Fresh

_________________

SAVE 25c I
When you buy six (6) 4-oz. cans Heinz Strained ( g  

Fruits, Vegetables and Juices &

Baby I
Food «

Fryer Quarters

49c
With this coupon. < 2

in expires April 16. 1977.

X & & & & & & & & & & & & & &
PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 25c
When you buy one (1) 18-oz. Btl. 

Kraft's

Bar-B-Q 
Sauce

With this coupon.
Coupon expires April 16. 1977.

$  
<2 
<2

<3
<2<2

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

S A V E25C
When you buy two (2) 46-oz. 

*  cans Hunrs

Tomato
Juice

With this coupon. 
Coupon expires April 16,1977.

<2

<2A?J v  Coupon expires April 16.1977. a S u W Q k

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 25c
When you buy one (1) 30-Ct. Box 

Piggly Wiggly Daytime

Disposable 
Diapers
With this coupon.

V A A A A  -  * " * • ■  *«P'tes April 16, 1977.

<2
<2<2

<2
<2
<2

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON
<2 <2

When you buy one (1) 7-oz. Can Johnson's FavorO?
SAVE 25c

Furniture
Polish

With this coupon 
Coupon expires Apnl 16. 1977.

<2
<2
<2

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 25c
buy one (1)
Glad Leaf

Yard
When you buy one (1) 5-CL Box 

Glad Leaf
I

With this coupon 
Coupon expires April 16, 1977.

& & & & & & & & & & & & & & & &

<2



Dear Edditor:
After recovering from the en- 

ishal shock of the recommenda­
tions of General Councel Bruce 
Bigelow recommending to the 
W.D.B. (Water Development 
Board) the issuance of a four 
year permit to both Plains 
Weather lmprovment Associa­
tion Inc. and Atmospherics Inc. 
1 have settled down and writting 
my sittiments to you and the 
W.D.B.
I remember from my history 

that back somthing like two 
hundred years a man known as 
King George 111 imposed on his 
colonies a tax which they were 
very much against, and not 
being aloud to vote on the issue 
rebeled.
Consiquently we now have the 

United States of America.
A countrv of many freedoms

set forth in the Constitution of 
the United States.

As I understand the basic 
freedoms, they consist of The 
Freedom of Religion. Freedom 
of the Press. Freedom to asem- 
ble, Freedom to own property 
without the fear of consification. 

Also a democratic system was 
set forth so that the people could 
vote on any Issue. This type of 
system is accepted in our coun­
try. and consiquently. we do not 
have any take overs by force as 
often takes place in dictator type 
of Government.

We have a very undemocratic 
development of a situation 
where by a group of people no 
larger than the area of less than 
one county telling the citizen of 
a area the size of twelve or 
thirteen counties that they must 
submit to an act of there liking. 

A action that we know is 
putting us into bankrupey and 
taking away from many of us a 
life time of savings.
This has been going on for six 

years a burdon that is too much 
for any body to expect its 
citizens bear, and now we are 
threatned with four more years

of having our rain clouds disi- 
pated befor our very eyes.
This means four more years of 

drouth.
We farmers are schooled in the 

school of experiance. observa­
tion. and with years of working 
out under the sky observing 
Mother Nature at work in all her 
wonder.

Now we are told that we must 
have a understanding of cloud 
physics and meteorology to be 
able to tell the effects of a silver 
iodide injection into clouds.

I must point out that when we 
see a cloud build up to the point 
of raining, and then a weather 
modification plane, from the 
hail supreshion program come 
bly around or through the cloud. 
What this cloud will disipate in 

fifteen to twenty minutes. 1 also 
wont to point out that these 
planes never appear unless the 
cloud is going to rain, I am also 
pointing out that this type of 
cloud is not one of those clouds 
in the 90 percent bracket that 
dissipates without producing 
rain or hail.
I am insulted by the insinua­

tion that we farmers and ranch­

ers because of lack of some type 
of degree do not know what we 
are seeing even though we have 
had the opportunity to observe 
clouds in the making, and 
raining all our lives.

I can name person after person 
that has seen these planes 
disipate the rain clouds in the 
summer.
Clouds that we depend on for 

mosture. to produce our crops. 
Our very livilyhood is being 

taken away from us because of 
this hail supreshion program. 

We people in what is known as 
the buffer zone, arc the people 
being hurt. You will note that to 
the west and north of the target 
area is where the drouth exist.

And what rain was recieved 
this year came durring the time 
the hail supreshion planes were 
not at work.
The only rains we have reciev­

ed durring hail supreshion acti­
vity are rains that cover the 
entire State. These rains come 
very seldom.
Our thunder storms that we 

depend on so much of the time 
are destroyed.

We are asking the people that

donated money, and painted 
there forms red to write the 
Water Development Board, and 
tell them just what the Hail 
Supreshion Program is doing to 
them. We had such a over­
whelming response in raising 
money and desire to pul a slop 
to this hail supreshion program, 
and by such overwhelming odds 
in our favor. What I do not see 
how the W.D.B. can issue 
another permit.

Without the ladies helping we 
could not have accomplished as 
much as we did, I would like to 
urge the women, that since this 
is such a busy time for the men, 
that if there husbands do not 
have time to write that they do 
so, and tell the facts just as they 
are to James Rose, Texas Water 
Development Board, Box IJ087, 
Capitol Station, Austin, Texas 
78711.

We must stop this program. 
Also we must urge the Speaker 
of the House, Bill Clayton, to 
see that House Bill 1108, and 
Senate Bill 632 be presented 
and passed, and be made into 
law befor May 6, at which time 
the W.D.B. could issue a four

year permit.
I his bill passed as it now reads 

will allow the citizens of the 
counties to vote on this issue if 
they so wish.

This is all that we ask.
Merlin Roberts. Morton, Texas 
In Behalf of Directors of 
Citizens for Natural Weather.

ONE MINUTE SP O R T S  Q U I Z
1. Who won the Heritage Golf
Classic?
2. Name the NCAA Cham­
pions.
3. Who was named MVP of
the series?
4. Who won the $150,000 
women’s professional tennis 
tournament?
5. Name the NL and AL 
Rookie of the Year in 1975.

A n s w e r s  To Sports  Ouiz
1. Graham Marsh.
2. Marquette 67- North Caro­
lina 59.
3. Butch Lee.
4. Chris F.vert.
5. John Montefusco, NL, Fred 
Lynn, AL.
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B O B  B U L L O C K  
Com ptroller of Public Accounts

Dear Mr. Mullock :
My mother recently passed 

away, leaving a farm and 
several hundred shares oj 
stock to my brother and I 
What is the deadline for Jiliny 
an inheritance tax return and 
/myiny the tax?

The return must be tiled 
within nine months of the 
death. An extension may be 
granted, however, in certain 
circumstances.
Dear Sir:

I recently opened a 
boutique. Someone from 
your office told me that I 
would have to post a bond in

, April 14, 1977, Page 7
order to obtain u sales lax 
p e r mi t  Is the bond 
necessary '

Yes. Slate law requires 
anyone going into business 
loi the first time since 
January I, 1074 to post a 
bond I he bond is security 
for the Stale by the permit 
holder.
Dear Mr Comptroller:

I never received any 
notification that /  owed 
property lux. Now I have 
received a hill for the 
delinquent tax, as well as a 
penally and interest. I don't 
mind puviny the lax, if I owe 
it hut do /  have to also pay 
the penaltv and interest since 
I wasn't notified o f the tax?

Yes. Even though the tax 
assessor-collector should have 
notified von of the tax vou 
owe, his failure to do so is no 
defense for non-payment of 
t a x e s .  N e i t h e r  t he  
Comptroller nor any tax 
assessor-collector or local 
governing body can legally 
waive or forgive penalty and 
interest  on del inquent  
property taxes.

-toe* •) now  MmUato it 
f to*Uto Uktruay anUtMtta> 
u * < >  ktk* Mm tWtftlMt 
pile* I* etc* tttrt. aictft ti 
■todXctoyMtto I* M i  to."

°* *«»« oi now u'*01-11°*

SAVE

*5.20
W IT H  THESE C O U P O N S

i* PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 50*
When you buy one (1) 48-oz. Btl. Rain Barrel

Fabric
f y  o —m* ————Softener

With this coupon.
Coupon expires April 16, 1977.

X  && & &  & && &  &  & &  &  & &  & &  ̂ 1
<2

RED R O M E

APPLES
California

avocados
Washington

O'Anjou pears
Crisp Radishes or

green onions
Fresh New Crop

asparagus
Premium Bakers

potatoes

lb .

For

lb .

lb .

lb .

VALUABLE COUPON WORTH <2.00
TOWARD THE HIRCHASE OF THIS WEEK *  FEATURED ITEM

SET OF 4 SOUP DISHES
Our Reg Discount Price 
Coupon Savings

$11.99
2.00

Your Price (with coupon) $9.99 
In the pattern of your choice

Coupon Soto Thru
April 16. 1977.

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON m v x
SAVE 25c

When you buy one (1) 14-oz. Pk|. Mrs. Peurs

FMl 
Fillets

With this coupon.
Coupon expires April IB, 1977.

>C& & & & & & & & & & & & & &
<2

<2

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 25c
When you buy one (1) 6-oz. Solid Glade All Scents

Air
Freshners

With this coupon 
Coupon uxpires April 16, 1977.

<2

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 15* |
When you buy one (1) 4-Roll Pkg. S

Charmln I
» Bath Tissue I

$  With thie coupon. $

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 20* |
When you buy one (1) 6.4-oz. Tube

Aim I
Toothpaste |

With this coupon. ^
Coupon expires April 19, 1977.

& &  & &  &  &  &  & &  &  & &  & &  I

SAVE 40* 1
hen you buy one (1) Pair Pigglv Wiggly Style #47

i« PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

1 Party
1 Hose

With this coupon.
£>  Coupon expires April 16, 1977.

PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 25* 1
When you buy two (2) Doz. Piggly Wiggly Grade A r j

<2
i Large

Eggs
With this coupon.

5 0  Coupon t ip i  res April 16, 1977.

X & & & & & & & & & & & & & &
PIGGLY WIGGLY COUPON

SAVE 15*
When you buy one (1) Gel. 9tl. liquid

Oorox
Bleach

With thle coupon.
Coupon expiree April IB. 1977.

& & & & & & & & & & & & & &

SAVE 25*
When you buy two (2) ROSE BUSHES. 

ASSORTED COLORS AND GRADE

ROSE 
BUSHES
With this coupon.

Coupon expiree April 19,1 9 7 7 .
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Rural Development 
Aids Industry
Self-help federal rural develop­

ment is achieving major success 
here with the Rural Develop­
ment Act of 1972 in a unique 
farmer cooperative venture in­
volving textile manufacturing. 

The project, started in 1975, 
reached another historic mile­
stone on April I when the 
Farmers Home Administration 
of USDA formalized its loan 
guarantee for $30.150.000 to 
American Cotton Growers cov­
ering 90 percent of the coopera­
tive’s construction loan from the 
Houston Bank for Cooperatives. 

FmHA made a conditional 
commitment to ACG in 1975 for 
construction of an integrated 
spinning-weaving-finishing tex­
tile mill for heavyweight denim. 
Its formal commitment could not 
be finalized until the plant was 
completed and approved after 
inspection.

Located about 40 miles north of 
Lubbock, the mill uses the 
open-end spinning method 
which is suited for the type of 
cotton produced on the High 
and Rolling Plains of Texas. It 
has the capacity to produce over 
20-million yards of M'/i-ounce 
indigo-dyed, finished denim an­
nually.

“This is one of the most stable 
projects we have ever support­
ed." Lynn Futch, state FmHA 
director, said in the document­
signing ceremony. Authority for

the agency's loan guarantee’ is 
contained in the business and 
industrial loan section of the 
Rural Development Act of 1972. 
The act provides for guarantee 
commitments for approved pro­
jects to stimulate jobs and 
economic enrichment opportuni­
ties in rural communities.
At the ceremony, David 

Dabbs, associate vice president 
of the cooperative bank in 
Houston, presented Futch the 
bank's check for $301,500 to 
cover the one percent fee charg­
ed by FmHA for providing the 
loan guarantee.
ACG has 3.000 members in 25 

ginning associations in Texas 
who deliver all of their cotton to 
the association's pool for mar­
keting and manufacturing. A- 
bout one-fourth of the pool is 
dedicated annually to the textile 
mill and the balance is marketed 
as raw cotton to domestic and 
international points.

L.C. Unfred of New Home, 
president of the cooperative, 
said that of all the milestones 
reached thus far by the associa­
tion, formalization of the loan 
guarantee seems most impor­
tant.

"It signifies that we have 
passed the tests put before us," 
he said, enumerating them
thusly:

* Criteria laid down by gov­

ernment regulations and the 
legislative act.
* The selling of the expanded 

version of the association to over 
2,500 producers in addition to 
the membership of what is now 
known as (he ACG-Crosbyton 
Division.
* Development of the neces­

sary “ seed" capital from re­
gional cotton cooperatives and 
the pool gin associations.
* Backing of the cooperative 

banking system.
* An investment on the pari of 

the city of Littlefield.
* Managerial expertise devel­

oped by the association.
* The quality of product being 

manufactured.

* The first-rate market for the 
association's manufactured pro­
duct.

The first yard of denim was 
turned out by the plant barely 10 
months ago. Since that time the 
facility has manufactured sever­
al million yards of cloth and 
made nearly $15 million in 
sales.
J.E. Chisholm, mayor of Little­

field, said the facility has turned 
the city into a vibrant, growing 
area. Building permits are up 
several times over the 1974 rate, 
15 new businesses have located 
in the area, school and church 
enrollments are thriving and 
over 600 new jobs are attributed

I* Wall Straetl
By Bob Hill

to the facility.

NFU Requesting Rate Increase
National Farmers Union offi­

cials from 22 states had a 
wide-ranging 80-minute discus­
sion late Tuesday afternoon at 
the White House in which the 
farm group leaders indicated 
the "dismay" of the nation’s 
farmers with farm commodity 
support rates established for 
1977 and proposed for 1978. 
President Jimmy Carter spent 

50 minutes with the Farmers 
Union presidents, including Te­
xas Farmers Union President 
Jay Naman of Waco.
The discussion included Vice 

President Walter Mondale and 
Secretary of Agriculture Bob 
Bergland. "I thought it was a 
worthwhile meeting," said TFU 
President Jay Naman. "The 
President expressed concern at 
the negative reaction from farm­

ers to his proposed farm pro­
gram."
"From the campaign assuranc­

es. farmers expected that sup­
port protection at the cost of 
production meant the full cost of 
production. What we have got­
ten so far is an almost straight- 
line extension of the Butz sup­
port levels," National President 
of the Farmers Union Tony 
Dechant said. "On top of that 
we are being nickel-and-dimed 
in the budget process.” 

President Carter said that "for 
the future we would like to have 
a stable agriculture with an 
agressive export capability." 
The President noted Monday's 

increases in support levels for 
1977 and the recommended 
levels for the four-year farm bill 
and said he regarded them as 
“ better than the Butz figures."

Credit unions have become big 
business. According to a 
spokesman for the American 
Bankers Association, they have 
also become a small but fast 
growing competitor of commer­
cial banks. Credit unions have 
been around for about 70 years 
in this country. They are cooper­
ative thrift institutions, owned 
by members, just as federal 
savings and loans arc owned by 
depositors. Stale savings and 
loans are different in that they 
are owned by shareholders who 
are not necessarily depositors. 

Last year, credit unions in 
some states began offering 
share-drafts, similar to interest 
bearing checking accounts. This 
is when the commercial banks 
took notice and filed a lawsuit 
which has at least temporarily 
halted the share-draft program. 
Despite that setback, credit 

unions are pushing ahead on 
other fronts. Next month, for 
instance, federally chartered 
credit unions hope to get con­
gressional authority to offer 
30-year home mortgages, 12- 
year personal loans, and pre­
authorized lines of credit. The 
last item opens the way for a 
systemwide credit card. All of 
these new powers for the federal 
credit unions are contained in a 
bill tacked onto legislation to
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your filter can get 
dirty, clogged, 
waste energy •  •
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Clean or replace dirty Air Filters 
on your furnace or air conditioning!

The purpose of a filter on your air conditioning or heating air blower is to keep the air inside your 
home clean. The filter catches dust and dirt before it can enter your home. In time, the filter will accu­
mulate dust and dirt . . .  if it gets clogged, it can’t do the cleaning job it’s supposed to. Then it begins 
to shut off the air flow and has the effect of making your air conditioning or heating unit work harder. 
When the unit works harder, it uses more electricity . . . and if it works too hard because of a dirty

filter, it can be damaged.To avoid damage to your unit, to keep your home cleaner, and to save energy and money, be sure 
filters are clean. Permanent types can be cleaned according to the manufacturer’s instruction. Non­
permanent types are replaced, since they are inexpensive. It is wise to check filters every 30 days.

Save energy . . . save money . . . use clean filters.
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extend ceilings on savings de­
posit interest rales which ex­
pired on March I . Right now the 
whole package is jammed up in 
Congress because of disagree­
ments over provisions of the bill 
unrelated to credit unions. 

Despite its growing power, the 
U.S. credit union system, with 
assets of $45 billion, is in no 
danger of overtaking the com­
mercial banking system with 
assets of just under $1 trillion. 
And it has a long way to go to 
catch up with credit union 
systems in Canada and Germa­
ny. Credit union systems in both 
of those countries have full 
service banks that engage in 
commercial and industrial lend­
ing as well as consumer loans. 
There are 22.618 credit unions 

in the U.S. (half of them 
federally chartered). Their as­
sets are growing by more than 
14 percent a year, faster than 
the growth of any other type 
financial institution. In the U.S. 
today, 33.6 million credit union 
members already have access to 
many kinds of installment loans 
(credit unions have 16 percent of 
installment loans market), lines 
of credit, direct deposit of 
paychecks, life and auto insur­
ance, trust and financial advice, 
travelers checks and money 
orders.

Eat more often
AUSTIN, Texas (Spl.) -  

Dr. Donald R D avis, a 
U n i v e r s i t y  of T e x a s  
biochemist, says the elderly 
need to eat a variety of foods 
and eat often — at least three 
times and maybe even four to 
six times daily.

He also advises older per­
sons to take it easy on salt and 
include fiber (mostly present 
in vegetables) in their diet.

Thos e  who h a v e  o s ­
teoporosis (softening of the 
bones) should take a calcium 
s upp l e me nt .  About  800 
milligrams of calcium are 
recommended daily for the 
average person, he says, but 
the average elderly person 
only g e t s  a b o u t  400 
milligrams

*  *  *  *

There's quite a differ­
ence between being pres­
ent and doing the work.

* * * *

A T T E N T I O N  
MU L E S HOE  AREA 

C A T T L E ME N
In regard lo  dead slock 

rem oval ... I f  you have a 
prob lem  w ilh  service ... 
w hether in  the feed yard or on 
Ihe fa rm  ... Please give US a 
chance! Thank You.

YOUR IO C A L USED 
COW DEAtER IN 

MUIESHOE
I ’ lione 9f>5 2903 
M ob ile  965-2429

Mul eshoe
Mi-Products

Inflation Mandates 
Teacher Pay Raises

By Nickie C. Landers
Do teachers in the state of 

Texas need a raise in salary? 
We arc all aware of what 
inflation has been doing to the 
cost of living in the last few 
years. Also we must bear in 
mind that most ecomynic ex­
perts expect a continuing in­
crease of at least six percent in 
the rate of inflation for each of 
the next two years. At present a 
first year teacher with a B.A. 
degree earns a state base of 
$8,000 a year; a second year 
teacher earns a state base of 
$8,300; a third year teacher 
earns a state base of $8,600. 
Muleshoe also pays an addition­
al $250 per year, but many 
schools throughout the state pay 
only this state base pay.
Recently Tom Jinks and Nickie 

Landers of the Muleshoe School 
System prepared a conservative

estimate of the cost of living for 
a beginning teacher, B.A. de­
gree, with no dependents. In­
cluded in this estimate were the 
expenses of income tax, retire­
ment system, hospital insur­
ance. rent, utilities, food, auto, 
clothing, and professional dues 
and fees. These expenses alone 
ran $8,749.44 per year, which is 
more than the beginning teach­
er makes without taking on an 
additional job. In fact this 
estimate of $8,749.44 is more 
than the teacher will make 
during his third year of service. 
Items omitted from our estimate 
but very important to many 
teachers were: advanced school­
ing for the improvement of 
teaching skills, recreational ac­
tivities, life insurance, savings, 
and contributions to churches 
and other charitable organiza­
tions. The following is a copy of 
that estimate.

INCOME

Beginning Teacher - B.A. Degree

EXPENSES

Beginning Teacher - Single. No 
Dependents

Expenses computed as follows: 
Income Tax (1 Allowance) 
Retirement (TRS)
Hospital and Medical Insurance 
Rent - House/Apartment

Per Month

$666.67

Per Month

$729.12

Per Month
$93.40
$40.00
$23.14

$150.00

Per Year

$8,000.00

Per Year

$8,749.44

Per Year
$1,120.80

$480.00
$277.68

$1,800.00

Utilities:
Gas
Electricity
Water
Telephone

Food

Per Month$20.00
$20.00$ 10.00$12.00

Per Year
$240.00
$240.00
$ 120.00
$144.00 $62.00

$100.00

$744.00

$1,200.00
Automobile Expense:

Per Month Per Year
Insurance $33.00 $3%.00
Gas and Oil $50.00 $600.00
Repair $20.00 $240.00
License $2.00 $24.00
Payment *100.00 $1,200.00

Clothing

Professional Dues and Fees
(CTA $10.00)
(TSTA $32.00)
NEA $25.00

totals

The level and quality of educa­
tion in Texas will be no better 
than the individual classroom 
teacher. If we are to obtain and 
hold top quality people t i ‘" 
teachers, we must be willing to 
pay at least a livable salary.

Neal B. Dillman. Superinten- 
A1D FOR WEST

President Carter has asked 
Congress for $844 million in 
loans and grants to assist com­
munities. farmers, ranchers 
and businesses stricken by 
drought in western and plains 
states.

$205.00
$50.00

$5.58

$729.12

$2,460.00

$600.00

$67.00

$8,749.44

dent of Muleshoe Schools, sent 
a copy of this conservativ esti­
mate along with a letter to 
Oovernor Dolph Briscoe, Sena­
tor Max Sherman, Senator Kent 
Hance, Speaker of the House 
Bill Clayton, and Representative 
Tom C. Massey.

USSR FISHING ZONE
MOSCOW--A 200-mile 

fishing zone went into effect 
March I around the coast of 
the Soviet Union, the govern­
ment news agency Tass said.
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OPEN RATES
1st insertion, per word • $.09 
2nd and add., per word - $.06 

NATIONAL RATES 
1st insertion, per word - $.11 
2nd and add., per word - $.07 
Minimum Charge • $.50 
CARD OF THANKS - $3.00 
Classified Display - $1.30 per 

column inch.
Double Rate for Blind Ads 
DEADLINE FOR INSERTION 
11:00 Tuesday for Thursday 
11:00 Friday for Sunday

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 
TO CLASSIFY. REVISE OR 
REJECT ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR 
ANY ERROR AFTER AD HAS 
RUN ONCE.

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom, fenced 
yard, carport. Phone 272-3616.
8-15t-tfc

FOR SALE: Northside Texaco 
service station. Call 272-4814. 
8-15s-8tp

£ A utom ob iles

FOR SALE: 1973 Ford Galaxie 
500. 4 door, hard top. Two 
tpne green with vinyl top. 
Loaded. Good condition. AM- 
FM radio, tape deck. 272- 
3540 after 5.
9-10s-tfc

EARN $80 WEEKLY at home 
stuffing envelopes. Information: 
Rush 50 cents and stamped 
self-addressed envelope: 

FINANCIAL MIRACLES 
P.O. BOX 15129 

FORT WORTH, TEXAS 76119 
l-15s-8tc

976 Camaro. Ask for 
at 3319 or 4739.
9-15s-tfc

Randy

3 H e lp  W a n te d
Need operators at Main Street 

Beauty Shop. Call 272-3448. 
3-12t-tfc

Experlencd line mechanic five 
day work week, other fringe 
benefits. Town and Country
Auto Muieshoe, Texas.
3-14s-tfc

R i a l  Estate
FOR SALE OR TRADE: 20 acres 
irrigated land. 2 miles from 
Muieshoe. Phone 272-5578 
after 6 phone 272-3658.
8-38t-tfc

10 F arm  Equ ipm ent
■HE—'.m.'T...- —______ __
FOR SALE: 8” Peerless irriga­
tion pump, complete with 70 HP 
Amarillo gear head. 170' set­
ting, excellent condition. Bar­
gain. 806-657-4507.
10-12s-8tc

FOR SALE: American corn dry­
er with gas motor and two fans. 
$2000. Phone 763-2781. 
10-15s-2tp

FOR SALE: ’/« mile Trimatic 
sprinkler. Four trail lines. 7” 
main line. 965-2877 Duayne 
Stevens.
10-14t-3tc

111 For S o ft  O r Trade*

or

FOR SALE: 2 bedroom. 2 bath 
trailer house, with appliances. 
On fenced lot with storm cellar 
and storage house. Call 272- 
4118.
11 -3t-tfp

2 bedroom house for sale; 1
bath, carpeted, garage. 1730 
W. Ave. B. Call 272-4643. 
8-14t-tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER: Brick, 
3 bedroom, 1V« baths, single 
garage, storm cellar, fenced 
yard. Richland Hills 272-3345.
8-13t-tfc

FOR SALE: Double wide mo­
bile home. 1140 square feet.
Good condition. Reasonably 
priced. Call 825-3463 Oklaho­
ma Lane.
U-8s-tfc

381 acres irrigated east of 
Muieshoe on Earth highway.

160 acres irrigated 
north of Muieshoe c 
way.

miles
high-

160 acres in alfalfa. Circle 
sprinkler. 4 miles SW of 
Muieshoe.

J.B. SUDDERTH REALTY 
INC.

BOX 627
FARWELL, TEXAS 

481-3288
8-6s-tfc

Looking For Your Dream Home?
Simple - where, when and why 
WHERE one mile south and V* 
mile east of Lazbuddie.
WHEN Now you may be 
wanting to retire - just raise 
your lovely family or you may 
just want to live in the country. 
WHY Cut your taxes, save on 
gas bill, this place has three 
lovely fire places. Save on your 
water bill, this place has its own 
water system. Save on grocer­
ies, raise your own. Lots of 
garden space. Save on high cost 
of butane, get about three years 
of increased prices off on this 
lovely home. These owners will 
carry some papers. You may be 
able to have your dream home at 
less cost than you think! By 
calling for an appointment and 
see this lovely home.

COWSERT REAL ESTATE 
OR

CHARLES VAUGHN 
EVENINGS 806-647-5449.

8-14t-tfc

3 speed 26'' men’s bicycle.
3 speed 24" woman's bicycle. 
40 gallon electric hot water 

heater.
Antique rolled edge bath tub. 

Barbra Haley 965-2682.
ll-15t-2tc

Kawasaki 500 good condition. 
8,095 actual miles. Asking $550. 
Call 4944 after 5 p.m. All day 
Saturday or Sunday. See at 921 
West Avenue D. 
ll-15t-tfc

$100 REWARD Offered for ar­
rest and conviction of anyone 
doing damage to paper stands. 
Muieshoe Publishing Co. 272- 
4536. 
llt-15-tfc

FOR SALE: Washer and Dryer. 
Coppertone color. Come by 
Williams Bros. Office Supply o: 
call 272-3113.

,11-lls-tfc

15 M i t f l l a n t o u t

FOR SALE: 180 acres for sale. 
Eight miles west of Muieshoe 
on south side of highway 84. 
Three irrigation wells. 

Smallwood Real Estate 
116 E. Avenue C 
Muieshoe, Texas

PHILLIPS HOUSE OF MUSIC 
118 MAIN

CLOVIS, NEW MEXICO
Pianos, organs, band instru­
ments. new and used. Profes­
sional repairs, sheet music, 
rentals, terms.

Phone:505-763-5041.
15-30s-tfc

Earn $80 weekly at home stuf­
fing envelopes. Information: 
Rush 50 cents and stamped 
self-addressed envelope: 

Financial Miracles 
P.O.Box 15129 

Fort Worth, Texas 76119 
15-12s-8tc

ROTOTILLING 
272-4120

15-15s-8tc

SPECIAL NOTICE: Little Tyke 
Furniture, apparel and accesso­
ries department store for little 
ones. 412 Mitchell, Clovis, N.M. 
Phone 762-6550.
15-12t-8tc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2 bedroom. 
1 bath, single garage, 1190 
square feet. 614 West Avenue 
C. Call 272-4714.
8-12t-tfc

FOR QUICK SALE: 2 bed
room, l'/> bath, garage, tool 
shed. Price $15,000 $3,000 
down will handle this.

Nice brick home, well locat­
ed. Double car garage, tool 
shed, storm cellar and garage 
apt. Lots of storage space. 

POOL REAL ESTATE 
272-4716

K- l.lttfc________________

17 S « « d  A F e e d

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom house. 
406 West Second. Call 272-4491 
after 5 p.m.
8-8s-tfc

SALES, LOANS 
AND

APPRAISALS
In Bailey County 30 Years 

KREBBS 
REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C.

FOR SALE: A stack of Sweet 
Sudan Hay. $1.25 a bale. John 
Withrow, 227-2164 Sudan.
17-14t-2tp

Public Notice
The Trustees of the Muieshoe 

Independent School District will 
offer for sale by scaled bids the 
following vehicles:

1-60 passenger bus • 1971 IHC 
chassis

I-60 passenger bus • 1970 IHC 
chasscs
These buses may be inspected 

at the s tbtnit bus barn between 
8:00a.m. and 5:00p.m. Monday 
through Friday.

Bids will be opened May 9, 
1977 at 8:00 p.m. The Board 
reserves the right to reject any 
and all bids in the best interest 
of the District.

Tom G. Jinks 
Director of Special Programs 

I5s-2tc

Public Notice
Notice To Bidders Of 

County’s Intentions To Let 
Contract For The Construction 
' Of A New Exhibition Center 

And Coliseum For 
Bailey County

SEALED PROPOSALS ad 
dressed to Glen Williams, Coun­
ty Judge, Bailey County, Texas, 
will be received until two o'clock 
p.m. C.D.T. on the 28th day of 
April, 1977, at the County 
Courthouse, for the construction 
of a new Exhibition Center and 
Coliseum.

Proposals will be accepted for 
each phase of the work to be 
performed or for combinations 
of any grouping of the work to 
be performed. All work per­
formed shall be under the 
direction of a construction man­
ager retained by the Owner.

Phases of the work to be 
performed shall be as follows: 
(1) Concrete, (2) Masonry, (3) 
Metal Building, (4) Carpentry, 
(5) Thermal Protection, (6) 
Doors and Windows, (7) Acous­
tical Ceilings, (8) Floor Cover, 
(9) Painting, (10) Overhead 
Doors, (11) Grandstand, (12) 
Plumbing, (13) Heating and 
Air-Conditioning, and (14) Elec­
trical.
Such proposals will at said time 

be publicly opened, read aloud 
and referred to the County 
Judge for consideration, with 
the final award of contract(s) 
proposed to be made on the 12th 
day of May, 1977, by the 
Commissioner’s Court convened 
at its regular meeting place at 
the County Courthouse.

Plans, specifications and con­
tract documents may be exam­
ined without charge at the office 
of the County Clerk, Bailey 
County Courthouse, Muieshoe, 
Texas.

Plans and specifications may 
be obtained by bona fide bid­
ders, upon deposit of $50.00 for 
each set, at the Office of the 
County Judge. All deposits will 
be refunded upon returning 
plans and specifications prompt­
ly and in good condition. No sets 
or partial sets will be issued to 
sub-bidders or material suppli­
ers.

Plans and specifications will be 
placed in appropriate Plan 
Rooms throughout the state for 
the use of sub-contractors and 
material suppliers.
A CERTIFIED OR CASHIER'S 

CHECK issued by a bank satis­
factory to the Commissioners’ 
Court, payable to the order of 
the County Judge, Bailey Coun­
ty, Texas, or an acceptable bid 
bond given by a reliable surety 
company authorized to do busi­
ness in the State of Texas, shall 
be submitted by each bidder, in 
an amount not less than five 
percent (5%) of the total bid as 
a guarantee that if awarded the 
contract, the bidder will prompt­
ly enter into a contract with the 
County and execute such bonds 
as are required. Bids without 
the required check or bid bond 
will not be considered.

Public Nolice
Notice To All Persons

Having Claims Against The
Estate Of Lillian M. Fort, 

Deceased
Notice is hereby given that 

original letters testamentary up­
on the Estate of Lillian M. Fort, 
Deceased, were issued to me, 
the undersigned, on the 11th 
day of April, 1977, in the 
proceeding indicated below my 
signature hereto, which is still 
pending, and that I now hold 
such letters. All persons having 
claims against said estate, 
which is being administered, in 
the County below named, are 
hereby required to present the 
same to me at the address below 
given, before suit upon the 
same are barred by the general 
statutes of limitations, before 
such estate is closed, and within 
the time prescribed by law. My 
post office address is Route 1, 
Box 266, Brownwood, Texas 
76801.
Dated this the 11th day of 

April, 1977.
Perry Carroll Fort, Executor 
of the Estate of Lillian M. Fort, 
Deceased, No. 1217, County 
Court, Bailey County, Texas. 

15t-ltp

I’m Proud To Be A Texan

THE SUCCESSFUL BID­
DERS) on the project will be 
required to furnish a perfor­
mance bond and a payment 
bond, each in the full amount of 
the contract, written by a re­
sponsible surety company to the 
Commissioners' Court, as re­
quired by Article 5160, 
V.A.T.C.S. ATTENTION is di­
rected to Article 5159a, 
V.A.T.C.S., which requires that 
not less than the general pre­
vailing rates of per diem for 
work of a similar character in 
the locality where the work is 
performed shall be paid all 
laborers, workmen and mechan­
ics employed in the construction 
of public works.

BIDDERS should carefully ex­
amine the plans, specifications 
and other documents, visit the 
site of the work, and fully inform 
themselves as to all conditions 
and matters which can in any 
way affect the work or the costs 
thereof. Should a bidder find 
discrepancies in, or omissions 
from, the plans, specifications 
or other documents, or should 
he be in doubt as to their 
meaning, he should at once 
notify the County Judge and 
obtain clarification prior to sub­
mitting any bid. No bid may be 
withdrawn for at least thirty (30) 
days after the scheduled closing 
time for receipt of bids.
THE COUNTY proposes to 

issue certificates of obligation in 
payment of all or a portion of the 
contractual obligations to be 
incurred. The successful bid­
ders) will be required to accept 
such certificates in payment of 
all or a portion of such contracts 
or assign such certificates to the 
party with whom the County has 
made provision for the contrac­
tor to sell and assign such 
certificates at their face value 
(no accrued interest), and each 
bidder shall be required to elect 
on the bid form whether he will 
accept or assign such certifi­
cates.

In case an ambiguity or lack of 
clarity in stating the contract 
price exists, the County reserv­
es the right to consider the most 
advantageous construction 
thereof or to reject the bid. The 
County also reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids.

Glen Williams
County Judge 

Bailey County, Texas
14t-2ttc

Public Notice
Notice Of intention To Issue 
Certificates Of Obligation

TAKE NOTICE that the Com­
missioner’s Court of Bailey 
County, Texas, shall convene at 
10 o'clock, a.m. on the 12th day 
of May, 1977, at its regular 
meeting place in the County 
Courthouse in the City of Mule- 
shoe, Texas, to consider the 
passage of an order authorizing 
the issuance of certificates of 
obligation of said County in an 
amount not to exceed $300,000 
for the purpose of paying all or a 
portion of contractual obliga­
tions to be incurred for (i) the 
construction of public works, to 
wit: a County exhibition center 
and coliseum and (ii) profession­
al services of a financial advisor; 
such certificates of obligation to 
be payable from ad valorem 
taxes.

Glen Williams
County Judge 

Bailey County, Texas
I4t-2ttc

By Tamara Gilliland
I am proud to be a Texan. If I 

had a choice to live in anv other
state, I would definitely chose 
Texas.
Texas is a rich state and has a 

good government. You have 
freedom to do many things in 
Texas. We don’t have very 
many bad laws. There aren’t a 
whole bunch of large cities in 
Texas, so it is mostly farm 
communities. I like that because 
we are not overly crowded. We 
don’t have a whole lot of crime, 
either.
The land is pretty in Texas, 

and we have a lot of it. We also 
have a variety of land. We have 
a few small mountains, dry, 
sandy, and land that is very wet.

There arc a lot ot things to do 
in Texas. Also, you can go to the 
coast, go to the mountains, go to 
the horse races, or you could do 
some shopping.
A lot of good people came from 

Texas. Hopefully there will be a 
lot more people from Texas.

I have talked to people from 
other states that tell me 1 am 
lucky to be a Texan. That makes 
me feel very proud to be a 
Texan.

I think Texas has a good school 
system, too. Proper schooling is 
very important to us, the young 
people. If we didn’t have good 
schools, we would grow up not 
knowing anything. If we didn't 
know anything when we got 
older we could't support our­
selves, much less a family. 
Texas has a good communica-

T rack Mules Finish Third At Clovis
Perez, and Richard Orozco, ran 
a 1:49.5. In the 440 yard dash, 
William Orozco ran a 61.3 and 
Bryce Kutzli ran a 63.9. In the

On Saturday, April 2, the 
Mules’ eighth grade boys trav­
eled to Clovis for their fourth 
track meet of the year. In the 
440 relay, Felix Norman, Ricky 
Medlock, Charles Walker, and 
Israel Orozco had a time of 50.0. 
In the 70 yard high hurdles 
Charles Walker finished second 
and set a new school record of 
10.3. The old record was 11.1. In 
the 100 yard dash, Albert Lopez 
was fifth with an 11.4. In the 75 
yard dash, Israel Orozco and 
Albert Lopez were fourth and 
fifth and both broke the school 
record. Israel Orozco ran and 
8.8 and Lopez ran an 8.9, the old 
school record was 9.0.
The 880 relay team, William 

Orozco, Bryce Kutzli, Bobby

MICHELLE TOWNSEL

SHELL1 HAWKINS

LATIN & ITALY
ROME--Trying to revive 

Latin in the land that created 
it, Italy is considering a plan to 
make sure no student gets 
away without some knowledge 
of the language. Latin may be 
included as a part of regular 
Italian language studies in the 
7th and 8th grades.

Team Brings Medals Home
On April 2, the seventh grade 

boys traveled to Clovis for their 
fourth track meet of the season. 
They gave medals to the boys 
placing first.
Receiving medals were Joe 

Martinez, John Orozco, Trent 
Kirven, and Monty Hysinger for 
winning first place in the 440 
relay with their best time of the 
year, which was 50.8. In the 100 
yard dash, Jeff Meeks ran a 
12.5, Larry Norman ran a 12.7. 
In the 75 yard dash. Johnny 
Ybarra ran a 9.3, and Jefl 
Meeks ran a 9.5. In the 660 
medley, Jeff Meeks, Raul Tor­
res, John Orozco, and George 
Vela ran a 1:21.3 and placed 
third.

In the 440 yard dash, Fernando 
Casanova ran a 65.8, and John­
ny Ybarra ran a 66.9. In the 120 
low hurdles. Ronnie Angeley
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120 low hurdles Jeff Hyde ran a 
17.2 and Greg Harrison ran an 
18.0. The 880 medley relay 
finished second with a time of 
1:47.7. In the 220, Richard 
Orozco ran a 27.2. In the special 
100 yard dash, Marvin Lewis 
ran a 12.4. The mile relay team, 
Ricky Medlock, Felix Norman, 
Bobby Perez, and Charles Walk- 
ker, finished first with a time of 
4:03.0.

In the shot put, Marvin Lewis 
finished fourth with a throw of 
41 ’9” and set a new record. In 
the discus, Carroll Precure and 
Marvin Lewis both threw 98 
feet. In the high jump Charles 
Walker broke his own record of 
4’10” with a jump of 4’11” . In 
the long jump, Ricky Medlock 
was sixth with a jump of 1 6 T ’. 
In the 880 yard dash Larry 
Beene was fifth with a time of 
2:26.8.

ran a 17.3, and Trent Kirven ran 
an 18.2. In the 220, Joe Marti­
nez ran a 26.4 for his best time 
of the year, and Raul Torres ran 
a 28.9. In the special 100, Monty 
Hysinger ran a 12.0, and Israel 
Del Toro ran a 12.7. In the 880 
relay, Joe Martinez, John Oroz­
co, Trent Kirven and Monty 
Hysinger placed first with their 
best time of the year, 1:47.6, 
and Larry Norman placed sixth 
with a time of 1:46.4.
In the host put. Israel Del Toro 

threw 29’2 I I n  the discus, 
Monty Hysinger threw it 84’ 
71/ : ” , and Wayne Precure threw 
it 72’9". In the high jump, 
Ronnie Angeley cleared 4’6” . In 
the long jump Johnny Ybarra 
jumped 13’9". 
CONGRATULATIONS!!!

Modem Education 
"What has your boy learn­

ed at school so far this term?"
"He has learned that he’ll 

have to be vaccinated, that his 
eyes aren’t really mates, that 
his teeth need repairing, and 
that his method of breathing is 
entirely obsolete.”

lion system, also. That is impor­
tant because we need to know 
what is going on in the other 
places.
Texas is not perfect, but nei­

ther is any other state. I would 
like to see more communication 
between the government and 
the people. 1 would like to see

more women get involved in tb 
government.

I am very proud to be a Texan 
I told you a few of the reason: 
why. There are many olhe 
reasons, too. I hope 1 never havi 
to move away from Texas am 
I’m glad I have been luck) 
enough to be a Texan this long. I 
hope all the other Texans are as 
proud of being a citizen of Texas 
as I am.

7th Grade Team Wins Second
On March 31, the seventh 

grade boys traveled to Littlefield 
for their third track meet of the 
season. They came in second 
place with a total of 204 points. 
The following people placed in 
their events.
In the 440 relay, Joe Martinez, 

John Orozco, Trent Kirven, and 
Monty Hysinger, placed first 
with a time of 52.8, and Larry 
Norman, Raul Torres, Johnny 
Ybarra, and George Vela came 
in second with a time of 54.0. In 
the 880 yard dash, Lary Norman 
came in second with a time of 
2:28.9, and Fernando Casanova 
placed fifth with a time of 
2:39.2. In the 120 hurdles, 
Ronnie Angeley placed fourth 
with a time of 20.2, and Trent 
Kirven placed fifth with a time 
of 20.2.

In the 880 medley, Jeff Meeks, 
Johnny Ybarra, Raul Torres, 
and George Vela came in first 
place with a time of 1:58.6, and 
Eddie Black, Frank Martinez, 
Steve Orozco, and Graviel Mar­
tinez came in third with a time 
of 2:11.8.

In the 100 yard dash, Monty 
Hysinger placed second with a 
time of 11.7, and Jeff Meeks 
came in fifth with a time of 12.5. 
In the 440 yard dash, Johnny 
Ybarra placed second with a 
time of 65.9, and Jesse Carrion 
came in fourth with a time of 
69.8. In the 330 hurdles, Trent 
Kirven came in second with a 
time of 53.0 and Ronnie Angeley 
placed third with a time of 53.0.

In the 880 relay. Joe Martinez, 
John Orozco, Raul Torres, and

Monty Hysinger came in firs 
with a time of 1:56.3. and Jesst 
Carrion, Alan Harrison, Kevir 
Howard, and Lynn Moore camt 
in fourth with a time of 2:15.7. 
In the 220 yard dash, John 
Orozco came in third with a time 
of 29.1 and Jeff Meeks placed 
fourth with a time of 30.8. In the 
1320, Graviel Martinez placed 
first with a time of 4:13.9, and 
Steve Orozco placed second with 
a time of 4:21.7. In the mile 
relay, George Vela, Larry Nor­
man, Fernando Casanova and 
Joe Martinez placed first with a 
time of 4:18.8.

Students Enter 
History Fair

Several eighth grade students 
entered the Llano Estacado 
Regional History Fair with their 
research papers. The History 
Fair was held on March 21, 
1977, at the Wayland Baptist 
College in Plainview, Texas. 
Fourteen of the students who 
entered, placed. Those who 
placed were:
First place - Benton Glaze and 

Leslie Cowan. Second place • 
Greg Harrison and Jeffery Dur- 
ben. Third place - Clifford 
Watson and Curtis Hunt. Fourth 
place - Jimmy Gleason and 
Adam Laredo. Fifth piace - 
Casey Farmer and Curby Brant­
ley. Sixth place - Rachel Chavez 
and Honorable Mentions went 
to Brenda Stevens, Brad Poy- 
nor. and Carrol Precure.
We would like to congratulate 

all these students!!!

SEVENTH GRADE 
This week’s seventh grade 

track star is Michelle Townsel. 
She really hustled and worked 
hard this past week. She parti­
cipates in the 440 yard relay, 
880 yard relay, 100 yard dash, 
and the 220 yard dash. We hope 
she will continue to put out a lot 
of effort for the Muieshoe Track 
Team.

Congratulations Michelle!!!
The seventh grade track star of 

the week is Kellie Overman. She 
has run the 440, 880, and 1320 
yard dashes and she has been 
on the mile relay. She also 
participated in some field events 
suchgps high jump, and long 
jump. She has put out alot of 
effort in each event she partici­
pated in. We hope she will 
continue to do her best.

EIGHTH GRADE
This week’s track stars of thw 

eek are Keva Roming and Nora 
Rojas. Keva runs in the 880 
dash and in the mile relay. She 
enjoys track very much. She 
came in first at the Olton track 
meet in the 880 run. and also 
helped in the mile relay.
Nora Rojas was the other one 

of the eighth grade track stars. 
Nora runs in the 440 and the 
1320 run. She does a very good 
job of getting in shape for these 
long distance runs. At Olton, 
she placed second in the 440, 
and placed first in the 1320.
We would like to say Congratu­

lations to these two outstanding 
people!!
This week’s eighth grade track 

star of the week is Shelli 
Hawkins. Sheilli runs in all ot 
the relays, does high jump and 
long jump. She is a very 
outstanding runner, and puts 
out the best of her ability in 
every one of these events.
Last week the relay team 

placed fourth on the 440, in the 
880, they placed second, and in 
the mile they placed second. 
She also placed third in the long 
jump.

The M.J.H.S. Journalism calss 
would like to say Congratula 
tions!!!

At Muieshoe Junior High 
r - |  J n
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Sixth Grade 
Student Wins

The Regional Science Fair was 
held at the South Plains College, 
in Levelland Saturday, April 2.

In the eighth grade, Clifford 
Watson and Brad Poynor were 
awarded third place.

In the seventh grade, a first 
place award and second place 
trophy in Junior High Biological 
Division went to Monty Hysin­
ger. Second place awards went 
to Tammi Bratcher and Dena 
Harrison and also to Kristi 
Henry and Stacey Barnhill. A 
third place award went to Alan 
Harrison and Wayne Precure. A 
fourth place award went to Kay 
Lynn Prather and Cindy Turner, 
Stacy Vandiver and Rhonda 
Mills.
In the sixth grade, Tamara 

Gilliland received a first place 
award and also a certificate 
presented by the Lubbock Area 
Pharmaceutical Association and 
a first place trophy in the 
Elementary Biological Division. 
Receiving a first place award 
and second place trophy in 
Elementary Physical Science Di­
vision was Tod Holt. A second 
place award was presented to 
Dale Hughes and Tyri Vandiver 
and Jackie Kutzli received a 
second place award. A third 
place award went to Abbye 
Kennedy.
We would like to Congratulate 

these people on their achieve­
ments.
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Department Of Health Aids OSHA Program
President Teddy Roosevelt is 

credited with originating the 
phrase. "Speak softy and carry 
a big stick." He might be proud 
to know that his approach is 
embodied in an unusual part­
nership between the federal 
Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration, better known as 
OSHA. and the Texas Depart­
ment of Health Resources.

In this partnership, state occu­
pational safety and health engi­
neers are the ones who speak 
softly, and the federal OSHA 
inspectors carry the big stick. 
Under federal law, every private 
employer in the United States is 
required to comply with a 
massive set of OSHA regula­
tions, designed to protect the 
health and safety of workers, 
'.he rules cover almost every 
conceivable aspect of the physi­
cal facilities and the environ­
ment of the workplace.
To ensure compliance with the 

regulations. OSHA personnel

conduct intensive inspections ot 
several thousand places of busi­
ness each year. When inspec­
tors find violations of the OSHA 
rules, the employer is assessed 
a citation and possible penalties 
if the violations are of a serious 
nature and given a certain 
period of time in which to 
correct the problem. At the end 
of that period of time, another 
inspection may be made. If the 
violations have not been correct­
ed. the empoyer can be fined 
again -- as much as $1,000 for 
each day from the time of the 
original inspection until the 
correction is made to OSHA's 
satisfaction.
Enforcing the highly detailed 

and complex regulations is 
OSHA’s only function. Under 
the law. federal inspectors are 
not permitted to provide consul­
tation and advice to employers 
on ways to improve the health 
and safety aspects of their 
businesses.

That's where the Texas De­
partment of Health Resources 
comes in. Through the Occupa­
tional Safety Division and the 
Occupational Health and Radia­
tion Control Division, state engi­
neers are available to provide 
consultative assistance to all 
employers in Texas. The consul­
tation program, funded under a 
contract between OSHA and the 
Department of Health Resourc­
es, allows employers to request 
a penalty-free inspection.

When an employer asks for an 
inspection, one fo the state 
engineers — who has been 
trained by OSHA -- visits the 
workplace and conducts the 
same kind of inspection that an 
OSHA inspector would perform. 
At the end of the inspection, the 
employer is given a list of any 
violations of OSHA regulations 
that the inspector has found.

But the state inspection 
doesn’t result in penalties. In­
stead. the state engineer offers

advice and suggestions on how 
to correct the problem, and 
points out other ways to improve 
the workers' safety and health. 
The employer is free to act on 
the advice or disregard it as he 
wishes. Except in rare cases 
where a substantial and imme­
diate threat to the life or safety 
of the workers might exist, the 
state engineers do not report 
their findings to the federal 
OSHA engineers.

Since the state consultation 
program began, the number of 
requests for consultative inspec­
tions has steadily increased. 
According to Walter Martin, 
Director of the Division of 
Occupational Safety, "At first, 
many employers were afraid 
that this would trigger an OSHA 
inspection." Later, however, 
Martin reported that his engi­
neers were swamped with re­
quests. "W e’ll make all of the 
inspections," Martin said, "but 
it'll take a little while."

In fact, a number of requests 
for inspections have come from 
employers that aren't even sub­
ject to OSHA regulations -  such 
as city governments, state agen­
cies. hospitals, and even federal 
military installations. Obvious­
ly, the employers know a good 
thing when they see it, and their 
concern for the health and 
safety of their employees is 
demonstrated by their interest 
in the consultative inspections.
The key question, however, is 

whether health and safety prob­
lems are corrected following the 
penalty-free inspections. As evi­
dence. Martin cites a letter from 
one of the state’s largest county 
hospitals. The letter was written 
two months after the state 
inspection report, and it lists 
seven violations that have been 
corrected. It closes, "Thank you 
and your engineer for your help 
in maintaining a safe environ­
ment for our patients, their 
visitors, and our employees."
The president of an oil drilling 

company wrote, "It is through 
inspections like this that we are
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able to train our people in the 
proper safety methods in work 
areas. Please convey my thanks 
to your engineer for his inspec­
tion and hope that sometime in 
the future he will be able tu 
again pay us a visit."
The executive secretary of one 

of the state's largest labor 
unions wrote, "Our organiza­
tion supports this slate program 
and we feel it should he conti 
nued and expanded to reach 
every place of employment in 
Texas.”

The evidence shows that the 
Texas Department of Health 
Resources can, indeed, gel a lot 
done by speaking softly .. and 
only in part because of OSHA's 
"big stick".

WooMn’l Cramp Her Style
New Stenog: “ How do you 

spell graphic'-with one T  or 
two?”

Boss-*"Well, if you're 
going to use any. you might as 
well go the limit.”

From The 
Pastors Desk

! * • *  v i p i b l l i l a
SELLING OUT TOO CHEAP:

Genesis 25:27-34; Hebrews 12: 
16-17 • The story of Esau, like 
that of Cain, stands out in the 
Word of God as a beacon of 
terrible warning. It is like a 
sign-board across the road of 
life: don't go beyond this
point - there is danger ahead." 
The whole life story of Esau may 
be sqmmed up as "that of the 
mast of a sunken ship, yet still 
visible above the overwhelming 
tides.” As we look briefly at his 
life, we observe the following 
things about him.

FIRST OF ALL AN INHERIT­
ED PRIVILEGE: Because Esau 
was the first born of twins - he 
possessed the privilege of be­
coming heir in his father's
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family. And because God cre­
ated man in His own image - 
man possessed certain rights, 
privileges and opportunities 
that are God-given, and no man 
can take them from him if he 
chooses to keep them. Out of a 
merciful heart God gives us 
certain rights and manners of 
choosing. We have the right to 
choose in matters of allegiance - 
loyalty - faithfulness and ser­
vice. We can either put first 
things first or do as Esau did. 
ESAU DESPISED HIS PRIV­

ILEGE: As he spoke with his 
brother he said: “ ... what profit 
is this birthright to me - what 
good is it?” Actually it was of 
no profit at all to him because he 
was thinking in terms of sensual 
and temporal things as being 
more important. He was simply 
living for the present - trying to 
take care of the temporal needs 
of the present. A lot of folks are 
seeking this means of life today 
- and if the Bible is true - and 
must agree that it is - they will 
come out in the end about the 
same way Esau did. Esau relied ’ 
too heavily on snap-judgment 
and allowed his appetite to 
dictate and overrule the higher 
instincts of his nature. Men are 
still making that same mistake 
today. By hundreds and thou­
sands they suffer temporal 
things to take the place of the 
spiritual. God urges always that 
we think soberly and use descre- 
tion in matters of the things of 
first import. The Bible says: "... 
seek ye first the Kingdom of 
God and His righteiousness and 
all these things shall be added 
unto you.”
WE ARE NOT SURPRISED 

WHEN WE FIND THAT ESAU 
LOST HIS PRIVILEGE: He lost 
it the moment that he put a price 
on his inherited birthright. He 
deliberately parted with it as a 
thing that possessed no value. 
To fail to accept and grasp an 
opportunity is to lose it. We live 
in a funny world - and there are 
a lot of funny people in it. There 
are always plenty of Jacobs 
around ready at any cost to 
others to make personal gain out 
of their spiritual stupidity. Mo­
ses looked at his birthright with 
a very different eye when he 
chose rather to suffer affliction 
with the people of God than 
enjoy the pleasures of sin for a 
season. A person's heart is 
never more deceitful than when 
it covets the things which are 
seen and temporal - and lets slip 
those things which are eternal.
It is bad and a bad bargain to 
sell the spiritual for that which 
is natural.
WE ALSO LEARN THAT 

ESAU LIVED TO REGRET HIS 
LOST PRIVILEGE: The other 
part of our text Hebrews 12: lb- 
17 says: " ... and afterwards 
when he would have inherited 
the blessing, he was rejected 
though he sought it with tears". 
The sin of unbelief is sure to be 
followed with a terrible ... 
'afterwards'. As Esau's father 
died, he brought conviction 
home to the heart and consci­
ence of his son - but his tears, 
though many and bitter did not 
restore his despised blessing. In 
the sixteenth chapter of Luke we 
are told of a similar 'affer- 
wards’. " ... Son, remember that 
thou in thy lifetime received 
good things, and Lazarus evil 
things, but now he is comforted 
and thou art tormented". He­
brews 2:3 gives a warning to all 
men: " ... how shall we escape if 
we neglect so great salvation".

ON CONGRESSIONAL MAIL
Congress has billed Ameri­

can taxpayers more than $60 
million for postage after a re­
cord outpouring of mail during 
the 1976 election season. In 
the last 10 years Congress has 
tripled the amount of mail it 
sends, according to Postal 
Service figures.

Ken Wade
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