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Yersatile Corn Provides Local Industry
f  Food Corn Facility 

Expansion Starting
Early in 1977, Valley 

Grain Products, headquar­
tered m California, an­
nounced plans to construct 
a food com holding facility 
in Muleshoe. At the same 
time, the company an­
nounced future plans to

The sidewalk sale is 
coming!!!! All of Muleshoe 
will be geared up for the 
annual Sidewalk Sale on 
Saturday, June 28.
Watch the Thursday issue 

of the Muleshoe Journal for 
all the special bargains to 
be offered.

*****
Adults (only) skating is 

scheduled for the Bailey 
County Exhibition Center 
on Monday, June 23 from 
8-10 p.m.

Admission for the adult 
only skating will be $1 per 
skater.

*****
A Ladies Day scramble for

0

construct a masa (corn 
flour) plant to be construct­
ed adjacent to the com 
facility.
This week, Valley Grain 

Products announced imme­
diate construction of eight 
more silos, capable of stor­
ing 22,400,000 pounds of 
corn. This will be approxi­
mately one-third increase 
in holding facilities, and 
bring the number of silos at 
their location southeast of 
Muleshoe to 34.
At the same time, they 

said the corn flour plant will 
be constructed in the future 
however, at this time, they 
are in the process of con­
structing such a facility in 
California.
Jeff Smith, manager of the 

local operation, said the 
masa plant under construc­
tion in California at this 
time is “ a very unique 
construction” . The design 
will allow the plant, or mill, 
to process 6,000 tons of 
masa per month, where the 
present mill only processed 
2.000 tons each month.” 

Smith said the demand for 
masa continues to grow, 
and there is more worldmembers of the Ladies Golf

iS-Slatfid. -demand for the product. He
added that Valley Grainoffnesday, June 25. Tee

time is 9:30 a.m.
Teams will be A - B - C - D

players and entry fee is SI. 
*****

On Friday, June 27, a 
youth disco is scheduled at 
the Bailey County Exhibi­
tion Center and Coliseum.

Admission is $2 each for 
the 9-midnight dance. Dis­
co sounds will be presented 
by Mickey Bear Enterprises
of Portales.

*****
Mike Windham, son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Scotty Wind­
ham of Lazbuddie, recently 
completed a week-long ori­
entation course on the Ral­
ston Purina Company’s 
Chow division in St. Louis, 
Mo.

He attended the course 
with 41 other college jun­
iors from across the nation. 
Mike has been assigned to 
work with a Purina Pro­
duction Manager on a spe­
cific project for the remain­
der of the summer.

He will be a senior at 
Texas Tech University this 
fall, majoring in Agricul­
tural Engineering.

*****

m

Products is currently ship­
ping masa to eight coun­
tries.
Construction on the initial 

phase of construction on 
the facility in Muleshoe 
started in November, 1977, 
and the local corn handling 
and shipping location o- 
pened in 1978. Smith said 
the eight corn silos to be 
under construction at the 
location near Muleshoe are 
expected to be completed in 
time for the corn harvest 
this year. He said they will 
be constructed just north of 
the current silos and all 
eight will be built at the 
same time.
Founder and President of 

the Company is Willard 
Pitman, who constructed 
the first silos in California 
24 years ago. He first 
started out with stock feed. 
Three years after starting 
the company, in 1955, he 
dropped the feed business 
and started producing high- 
quality corn.

In 1963, he constructed 
the first masa flour plant in

Cont. on Page 3 Col. 3

Fuel Alcohol Plant 
Construction Slated

GROUNDBREAKING FOR ALCOHOL PLANT.... Wednesday morning, several members of the Muleshoe Chamber of 
Commerce and Agricultural, along with representatives of Charmec Corporation of Florida and Tagco of Hereford were 
at the site where a fuel alcohol plant will be constructed at progress. Several shovels were used for the symbolic 
groundbreaking ceremonies for the plant, which is expected to be operational by October.

County’s Taxable Sales 
Showing Slight Increase

J m

■

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock reported gross 
sales in Texas for 1970 
totaled more than $213.8 
billion.
Bullock said a sales tax 

analysis of gross sales for

Holmes ‘ First ’ 
Republican, 
Female JP

Two ’firsts’ were recorded 
in Bailey County last Mon­
day when Tana Holmes was 
administered the oath as 
Justice of the Peace for 
Precinct One.
Judge Holmes became the 

first female JP in the 
county, and at the same 
time, became the first Re­
publican to hold an office 
on the county level.

A Bailey County resident 
for the past 17 years, Mrs. 
Holmes is married to 
Claude Holmes, a mechanic 
for Muleshoe Motor Co. 
and a member of the Mule- 
shoe Fire Department.
She and her husband arc 

the parents of Dana Jame­
son of Friona and Jimmy, a 
freshman at Muleshoe 
High School.
She said she will be main­

taining office hours at the 
Bailey County Law En­
forcement Center from 8 
a.m .-5 p.m. Monday - Fri­
day. and will be subject to 
call by local and county 
officers at night, weekends 
and on holidays.
Her oath was administ­

e red  by Bailey County 
Judge Glen Williams at his 
office in the courthouse. 
She was named to fill a 
vacancy left when former 
Justice of the Peace K.B. 
Martin resigned April I. In 
the interim. Judge Wil­
liams filled the capacity as

the year's last calendar 
quarter showed that gross 
sales reached $66.9 billion, 
up $14.4 billion over third 
quarter gross sales.
The gross sales figures 

were gathered from 
329,405 reporting outlets 
across the state. 
Out-of-state gross sales 

received from 5,867 report­
ing outlets from the same 
period totaled $5 billion.
He said gross sales for 

Texas amounted to $186 
billion.

Bullock also released a 
computer analysis showing 
reported sales for each of 
the state’s 254 counties and 
a sales tax analysis broken 
down by the state's Stan­
dard Metropolitan Statisti­
cal Areas.

From Bailey County, the 
257 reporting outlets had 
reported sales of 
$28,190,027 with
$28,190,027 being taxable 
sales and deductions of 
$23,851,619 and use tax 
purchases of $16,098 for 
$4,354,506 being subject to 
taxation.
Castro County reported

Little League 

Team Pictures 
Are Scheduled

Pictures will be made of 
all Little League Teams, 
T-Ball, Minor and Major 
Leagues, on Thursday, 
June 26. at 5:30 p.m. at the 
Major League Park.

All players on all teams 
are required to Ik- at Roger 
Miller Park in full uniform. 
Persons who want indivi­

dual pictures of team mem­
bers musi make arrange­
ments in advance hv calling 
loniniv Gunstream or

gross sales of $43,104,090 
from 243 reporting outlets

Local Crops
Re - Planted 
After Storm

Some three weeks ago, a 
blistering sandstorm virtu­
ally wiped out crops on 
drylands in southern Bailey 
County and inflicted heavy 
damage to young cotton all 
over Bailey County.
This week, most farmers 

have replanted, or are in 
the process of re-planting 
the devasted dryland 
farms. However, the land 
was not re planted with 
cotton. Most of the farmers 
have planted grain sor­
ghum, or in a few instances 
soybeans.

Karen Oxford at the Ma­
ple Grocery said most far­
mers have replanted al­
though moisture is really in 
short supply. “ We have re­
ceived very little rain.” she 
commented.

Bennie Claunch at Bula 
said at this time . the com­
munity has no crops, and 
most arc re-planting in 
grain sorghum. Claunch 
said there is very little 
cotton left, and most of that 
is irrigated cotton. He said 
the Bula community is very 
dry.

Despite a solid week of 
rain in surrounding areas, 
and in some instances, 
damaging hail and wind, 
Bailey County was skipped 
by all of the moisture, with 
very light, intermittent 
showers.

In northern Bailey County, 
the irrigated crops are in 
excellent condition. the 
corn is rapidly growing. 
Might damage was noted to

and deductions of
$38,900,781 with the use 
tax purchases determined 
at $137,346. This made 
their amount subject to tax 
$4,340,655.
Gross sales for Cochran 

County’s 117 reporting 
outlets were a total of 
$9,236,490, with deduc­
tions of $7,751,933 and use 
tax purchases of $7,024 for 
$1,491,581 being subject to 
taxation.

In Lamb County, 511 re­
porting outlets had gross 
sales of $57,592,158 with 
deductions of $49,712,441 
and use tax purchases of 
$82,026. This left Lamb 
County’s taxable amount of 
sales at $7,961,743.

A total of 245 reporting
Cont. on Page 3 Col. 4

Wednesday morning, 
Bailey County Judge Glen 
Williams officially turned 
the first shovel of dirt in 
groundbreaking ceremo­
nies for a new fuel alcohol 
plant to be constructed at 
Progress.
Charmec Energy Corpor­

ation of Florida, with Gene 
McGuire, a lifetime Bailey 
County resident as presi­
dent, will be constructing 
the new plant near Mule­
shoe.
Already on the site is a 

grain drying and storage 
system, and the fermenta­
tion building, distillation 
facility, dry silage storage, 
offices and alcohol storage 
will be constructed. The 
plant is expected to be 
operational in October, said 
McGuire, and will initially 
produce 2,400 gallons of 
alcohol per day, with ex­
pansion in six months to 
7,200 gallons each day.
The alcohol will be used 

for the production of gaso- 
hol, a mixture of 10 percent 
ethanol and 90 percent 
unleaded gasoline.

McGuire said he has 25 
acres of land' at the site, 
and expects the location, 
adjacent to the Santa Fe 
Railway, to provide ample 
expansion room. Gasohol is 
currently being sold locally, 
and McGuire said an at­
tachment is being man­
ufactured to inject alcohol 
into diesel engines. The 
alcohol for use in farm 
machinery only has to 100 
proof, he said, and is much 
cheaper to produce.

“ During the alcohol pro­
duction process,” said Mc­
Guire. "valuable by pro­
ducts are formed. The ma­
jor by product is Distillers 
Dried Grain (DDG). It is the 
remnant of the corn used to 
make the alcohol."

"The DDG is sold as a 
high protein feed for cattle. 
Another by-product is car­
bon dioxide. For every gal­
lon of alcohol produced, 
6.33 pounds of carbon di­
oxide is formed. Large 
quantities of carbon dioxide 
are used in older oil wells to

Com m unity Survey 
Set Here Thursday
Jeff Smith, chairman of 

the Muleshoe Area Indus­
trial Foundation said the 
long-awaited community 
survey will be made Thurs­
day, June 20, beginning at 
6:30 p.m. Members of 
Bailey County 4-H youth 
will be distributing the 
survey forms to all house­
holds in the city of Mule- 
shoe.

An hour after the survey, 
forms arc distributed, the 
youths will again be knock­
ing on doors to pick them 
up. The evening will be 
used to accumulate the 
completed survey forms to 
attempt to ascertain what 
basic community needs w ill 
lake precedence.

In conjuetkin with the City 
<1 Muleshoe. the Industrial 

Foundation survey form 
will be used in an attempt

not receive a survey form 
may pick up a form at 
Muleshoe State Bank. First 
National Bank or Tri • 
County Savings and Loan 
Association. Although a 
house-to-house survey will 
not be conducted outside 
the city limits. Smith added 
that he would encourage all 
interested persons to com­
plete a survey form at one 
of the banks and mail the 
completed form to Jeff 
Smith at Valley Grain Pro­
ducts.

Also, a seperate survey 
w ill be made of local busi­
nesses. Business owners 
and operators will be asked 
to complete a survey form 
lobe distributed during the 
week.

Results will be tabulated, 
with the South Plains As 
socialion of Governments

increase their production. It 
can also be sold as a 
welding supply, as dry ice, 
or used in fire extinguish­
ers."

He also explained that 
several government options 
and incentives are available 
for alcohol producers. The 
Energy Tax Act of 1978 
authorized a 10 percent 
additional investment tax 
credit for alcohol produc­
tion equipment. This is an 
addition to the existing 10 
percent tax credit. Also, 
gacohol is exempted from 
the four cent per gallon 
Federal Excise Tax on gas­
oline until 1992.
Gene McGuire has been a 

farmer in Bailey County all 
of his adult life. He is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. A.R.

Cont. on Page 3 Col. 3

Explosion, 
Fire Level 
Man’s Home

Shortly after 12:30 a.m. 
Friday, calls started coming 
in to the Bailey County Law 
Enforcement Center, in­
forming dispatcher Melba 
Cunningham that a house 
in Progress had exploded 
and was burning.
Arriving firemen found 

the only thing they could do 
was contain the fire in the 
immediate area, as the 
explosion and fire had lev­
eled the home of Ed Has­
kins,

Haskins said he woke up 
and the house was afire. He 
said he was very frightened 
by the fire, so he jumped 
into his car and drove down 
the road. "I forgot to turn 
on my car lights,” he said, 
"and drove off into a deep 
ditch."
The ederly man sobbed as 

he watched his only pos­
sessions go up in flames. 
Glass, window frames and 
screens were blown into the 
road and in some instances 
across the road from the 
blazing home.
The force of the explosion, 

which Haskins said he 
never heard, blew the north 
and east walls of the home 
outward, and the roof fell 
in. From the force of the 
explosion, one tree on the 
north side of the home 
broke off under the weight 
of the north outside wall of 
the home.

Haskins, who said he was 
not injured, also said his 
wife was a resident of the 
Muleshoe Nursing Home, 
Firemen attempted to get 
the Haskins vehicle out of 
the deep ditch, adjacent to 
a culvert, but were unable 
to remove the car. They 
remained at the fire scene 
for several hours.

One fireman said when 
they first arrived, they had 
to move debris which had 
blown into the road before 
they could get clos? enough 
to pul any water on the fire. 
They were hampered by a 
lack of water, having only 
what w atcr is carried on the 
regular fire trucks.

Haskins was laken to the



w

Page 2, Bailey County Journal, Muleshoe, Texas, Sunday, June 22. 1980

Picture To Be Given Away-----  ' ’ Texas Chamber Industrial Tour

DRAWING JULY 4TH.... Margaret Clements and her 
grandaughter are shown displaying a picture that will be
given away July 4th.

The Northwest Texas 
Chapter of the Mvasthenia 
Gravis Foundation is offer­
ing a 20 x 24 picture to be 
given eway at the fireworks 
during the 4th of July 
celebration here in Mule- 
shoe
This picture, a Texas 

bluebonnet scene taken cn 
the LBJ Ranch in the Texas 
hill country, is photography 
art donated by Van Greene 
of Lubbock, a member of 
the N.W. Texas Chapter. 

For a 50 cent donation to 
the Myasthenia Gravis 
Foundation, you will re­
ceive one chance to become 
the proud owner of this 
picture. The donations are 
being taken now, and will 
be taken all day at the Civic 
Center July 4th.

You may contact Margaret 
Clements at 4435 or Jenne 
McVicker at 4741 or see the 
picture on display at Al­
bertson’s.
The proceeds from these 

donations will be used to 
futher research and educa-

Hadley Reunion Held In Friona
The family of the late F.H. 

Hadley met Saturday, June 
14, at the Friona Grade 
School Cafeteria for a re­
union.
The last reunion was held 

on Fathers Day, June 20, 
)%5. Registration began 
Saturday at 10 a.m., with 
74 signing the family record 
book.
Just before the noon meal, 

gifts were presented to the 
oldest family member, L.D. 
Cannon of Muleshoe, the 
youngest, Amanda Pope, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Pope of Friona. Also 
for the ones that came the 
longest distance and it went 
to Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Cannon of Sand Spring, 
Oklahoma.

A floral arrangement was 
presented to the couple 
married the most years, 
that going to Mr. and Mrs. 
L.D. Cannon of Muleshoe, 
who celebrated their 60th 
wedding anniversary in 
February of this year.
After the dinner, the 

group spent the afternoon 
visiting, reminiscing, tak­
ing pictures and showing 
pictures.
Those attending were : 

Mrs. Jessie Hadley of Bor- 
ger, Billy Hadley and Jo 
Riley of Grover. Phillip 
Hadley, Janice, Bill and 
Danny Fritz of Pampa, Mr. 
and Mrs. Marvin Gaddy 
and Terri of Duncanville, 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Can­
non of Clovis, Mr. and Mrs. 
Aubrey Cannon of Lub­
bock.

Also Mr. and Mrs. Ronny 
Cannon and family of Sand 
Springs, Okla. , Mr. and 
Mrs. Tex Paris and daugh­
ters of Midland, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jay Spain and Betty 
Freeman of Hereford, Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas Shoe­
maker and family of Hico, 
Mr. and Mrs. Otto Hut­
chens. Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Pilgrim, Mrs. Shelia Man- 
asco and Jeremy of Ama­
rillo. Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Sanders of Mangum, Ok., 
Mrs. Don Timms of Texico, 
N.M., Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenny Bails and family of 
Dimmitt, Mr. and Mrs.

'w  w w w

L.D. Cannon, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Pope and Jeff of 
Muleshoe, Lynn Pope of 
Hereford.
Those attending from Fri­

ona were Ida Hadley, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Lee Hadley, 
Shasta Page and son, Irene 
Pope, Mr. and Mrs. A.D.

Crawford, Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Loftis and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Bea­
vers and sons, Carl Hadley, 
Mr. and Mrs. Gib Trigg, 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Pope 
and Amanda, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leo Bails and Christopher 
Bails.

JOY ChoirMetting
There were approximately 

50 present Monday night, 
June 16, when members of 
J.O.Y. Choir of the First 
Baptist Church and their 
guests met in the fellow­
ship hall for their regular 
monthly meeting.
The meal was served at 7 

p.m., the prayer of thanks 
for the food was led by Cliff 
Goodrich.

After the meal, the group 
sang several songs and 
were entertained by special 
members presented by 
Carroll and Susie Rhodes 
and their guests. These 
guests were her parents, 
Rev. and Mrs. Harry 
Grantz of Breckenridge, 
where he is the pastor of 
the First Baptist Church. 
Also Susie Rhodes’ brother 
and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bill Grantz and Amada of 
Jacksonville, Florida were 
guests.

Also present were Mrs. 
Pearl Vaughn of Bakers­
field, Calif., sister of Mrs. 
Sherman Inman, Jeremy 
Boomer, grandson of Mr. 
and Mrs. Cliff Goodrich, 
Jeremy is from Denver, 
Colo. Visiting with Mrs. 
Raneta Dawson was her 
granddaughter, DaLynn 
Krebbs of Amarillo.

Present for the first time 
were Mr. and Mrs. Vic 
Benedict. Attending from 
the Muleshoe Nursing 
Home was Charlie Garth.
After singing their closing 

song, “ Blest Be the Tie 
That Binds’’, the group was 
dismissed with a prayer led 
by Mr. Garth.

RECIPE
By Sarah Anne Sheridan

Dessert time comes 
around like clockwork-- 
almost too regularly for the 
harassed meal planner. Here 
are two that should find favor 
with the homemaker.

Chocolate Almond 
Refrigerator Cake

I c prepared whip 
cream substitute 

Vi c finely chopped 
chocolate covered 
almonds

16 Graham crackers 
8 whole chocolate cov­

ered almonds

Add chopped almonds to 
Vi cup cream substitute. 
Spread on Graham crackers, 
place together to make a loaf. 
Wrap in plastic wrap. Chill 
overnight. Just before serv­
ing spread remaining cream 
on loaf Garnish with whole 
almonds.
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Twirling Classes Offered
Beginning In July 

Now Registering For Classes
Accepting

Heginner* & Intermediate
ClnNNfM Will Be Held At

H a tr k in n  & P u r d y  S c h o o l  o  f  D o n e e  

For More Information 
Call

Sue Bessire 965-275 7
or
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TOOL
VALUE
OF TH E MONTH

.a .

now
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12-PC DRIVE 
SOCKET SET
Nickel chrome plated set in­
cludes 7 3/8-in drive sock­
ets, spark plug socket. 3-in. 
extension, reversible ratch­
et. speeder disc MM81?

KM S . 1 st.

I H u S f . J i i i f  

2 7 2 - 1 3 1 1
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tion in the constant fight to 
find the cause and cure of 
this dreaded disease, my­
asthenia gravis. “ The
N.W. Texas Chapter sin­
cerely appreciates and 
thanks you for your help 
with this project, ’ said a 
spokesman for Myasthenia 
Gravis.

The 1980 West Texas 
Chamber Industrial Tour 
will visit the cities of De­
troit, Cleveland and Pit­
tsburgh on September 2-5, 
according to'Bob Brummal 
of Lubbock, chairman of the 
WTCC Private Enterprise 
Development Committe.
The purpose of the tour is

to contact industrialists in 
these midwestern cities to 
share the advantages of 
expanding or relocating 
their enterprises to West 
Texas. Those attending the 
luncheons will have ex­
pressed some interest in 
West Texas as a possible 
industrial site, and there

LCHS Coach To Direct Camp
Dale Pectol, who coached 

the Lubbock Christian High 
School girls basketball 
team to a Texas Association 
of Private Schools state 
championship last season, 
will direct all three sessions 
of the Lubbock All-Girls 
Basketball Camp this 
summer.
The camp will be begin­

ning its fifth year of ex­
istence, making it the city's 
oldest basketball camp.
One session will be held 

during the day, 8 a.m. to 5 
p.m., June 30 • July 3. The 
other two sessions will be 
for overnight campers and 
will be held July 14-18 and 
July 21-25. Cost for the day 
camp is $65 and includes 
instruction, a noon meal 
and a camp T-shirt. The 
overnight camp cost of 
$97.50 includes three meals 
per day, a dormitory room
at Lubbock Christian Col-. 
lege, entertainment each 
night, instruction and a 
camp T-shirt.
Girls in the third grade

and up are eligible for the 
camp, provided they have 
not participated on a varsity 
athletic team. The camp 
does not affect ninth grade 
or junior varsity eligibility.

The basic fundamentals of 
offense, defense, shooting, 
dribbling and passing will 
be taught, with special 
emphasis being plaeed on 
defensive play, post play 
and jump shot techniques.

Video-tape machines will 
be used to help instruct the 
campers. Pectol will also be

aided by several top high 
school and junior high 
school coaches from the 
Lubbock area.

will be opportunities during 
the meetings for West Tex­
as representatives to meet 
the prospects and explain 
the particular advantages 
of their hometowns.

Last year, West Texans 
representing twenty - one 
cities visited the Los An­
geles and San Francisco 
areas hosting a total of 107 
industrial prospects, ac­
cording to Brummal. “ Tour 
participants turned in ex­
cellent evaluations of the 
1979 tour, and we antic­
ipate the same kind of 
excellent response from 
businessmen in these cities 
looking for an alternative to

the high taxes, construction 
costs, labor costs and ener­

gy problems they exper­
ience in doing business 
where they live. West Tex 
as has many advantages to 
offer," Brummal said.
Reservations for the 1980 

tour are being accepted on 
a first-come, first-served
basis through August ,
with participation limited
due to hotel and airline 
space available for t ese 
dates. If interested in re­
ceiving further information 

on tour participation, call 
the WTCC administrative 
office in Abilene (915) 
677-4325, or write P-O-Jj0* 
1561. Abilene, Tx. 79604.
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Daily ribbons will be given 
to winners of special drills 
and competitions, and spe­

cial awards will be given at 
the end of each session.

j S H O E l
B A N K jiK E rs

101 A M E R IC A N  BLVD. • 272-4561 • Member FD IC

Ken - Ride Spot Sprayers
8 Row With Shades 

Trailer Mount Pull Type or 
Tractor Front Mount

Dealerships Available 
Ken - Ride Sales, Inc*

Levelland
894- 5074 or 8 9 4 -5638

DEGURES JIME-
MICHELIN MONTH!

AS LOW AS N o w  S a v e  $ 6 7 - 1 4 5

A
O n  S e t s  o f  F o u r *

Michelin X Whitewall

155-i13XZX • Black wall 
FET S t 48

E0UIV REG SHOOK
SIZE SIZE PRICE PRICE

175 14 BR 78-14 85 36 64 00
135-14 EH.'8 14 96 55 72 00
205 14 C'!7B 14 103 89 78 00
215 14 MH 1, 14 109 81 82 00
195 15 HUB 15 100 74 76 00
205 15 r»R?S 15 109 96 82 00
215 15 hh;8 Vi 115 74 87 00
2?5 15 .ih;b if. 120 30 90 00
235 15 .IWBU u14?

FET S? 08 - 3 38

107 00

*Off Suggested Michelin Prices

f>

Free
Mounting

Balancing Available 
at Additional Cost

W heel A lign m e n t 4 Wheel Drum
Brake Service• Set caster 

and camber
• Set toe-in
• Road te st car

• Install New Shoes • Rebuild Wheel Cylinder*
• Bleed System • Add Brake Fluid • TunTDrums

Parts Additional 
It Needed

Most Cars

79.88
Oise Type 
Slightly Higher

Most Cars
< -

> R A D I A L - T U N E D  S H O C K S

17.50 EACH Installation
Available

Lifetime warranty 

Automatic 6-way valving
Prices Effective Thur June 28

301 N. First • 272-3420 
Manager: John Robinson

«»w CHit« rouci _“T "A mw'i . 11,1 £•**•? i.
m i .ta.,, .. 1 ^  '•■>*•«'% mi a mth II 
>»nmi unmnn. A'1**1 **** *• VISA
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FUEL PLANT PLANS.... Gene McGuire is president of Charmec Energy Corporation, and will 
be constructing a fuel alcohol plant at Progress, adjacent to the railroad track. Pictured is a 
plan of the initial construction, along with plans for future expansion of the plant.
ON THE ECONOMY

The g o v e rn m e n t's  
economic forecasting index 
showed a record 4.8 percent 
decline in April, suggesting 
the nation is in for a steep 
but short recession this year, 
experts in and out of govern-»

The nearer we come to 
great men the more 
clearly we see that 
they are only men.

”** r  -Jean de la Bruyers.

MILITARY SALES
In a historic move, the 

Carter administration recent­
ly cleared the way for the 
first sales of military-related 
equipment and technology to 
tbc communist government 

** of China.

Alcohol • M
Con't from page I 

McGuire and is married to 
the former Kerma Nickels. 
They are the parents of 
three sons.
Charmec Group Inc. has 

cited Muleshoe as a strong 
agricultural community 
with an abundant supply of 
the necessary resources re­
quired for alcohol produc­
tion. The raw materials to 
be used for fermentation 
will be corn. McGuire said 
he will be producing some 
of the corn used for pro­
duction of the ethanol, and 
the corporation will be pur­
chasing corn from area 
farmers for the other pro­
duction.

Food...
Con't from page 1

North Hollywood.
At the Berenda Research 

Center, the company is 
producing taco shells, tor­
tilla chips and other fin­
ished food products. Pit­
man said the annual sales 
for his company are about
S25 million, and he plans 
expansion in some part of 
his California or Texas 
based corn handling facili­
ties each two years.
Locally, Valley Grain Pro­

ducts does not grow its own 
corn, but contracts it from 
local and area farmers. 
Smith said they provide a 
field program where the 
people from Valley Grain 
Products work with the corn 
producers. "W e try to help 
the farmer produce more 
corn,” explained Smith. 
"More com makes a hap­
pier producer as he re­
ceived more money.”

After three years in Mule- 
shoe. Smith indicated the 
company is very pleased 
they are facing an expan­
sion program to handle the 
millions of pounds of corn 
to be moved to California to 

■ produce food*.

Store Hours: 
Mon-Sot. 9-7 

Sun.1-6

JP*

y*r

Prices Effective 
June (22 • 25)

Men's or Boys Brown

Joggers

num. 3004

$ 0 0 0

Dishwashing Uq.

Ivory

95
22 FI. oz.

Toni

Lightwaves

$379

Ladies Pul -on

Children's

Joggers

num. 54

$ T O O

Jergens Lotion
15 FI oz.

*165

Singh Roll

ScotTowels

2 /1 0 0
7 1

*  Raid

Yard Guard
16 oi.

Giode Sold

Air Freshner
6 oi.

3/99<
Girls T - Back Terry

Tank Tops
Reg 4” r

$ 3 7 9

Delsey

Bath Tissue
4 - rl. pk.

79
EVERY DAY LOW PRICES 

Gal. Homo M ilk ~ "~ *2 ”  
’/2 Gal. Homo Milk $113

Gal. Lowfat M ilk.....*19S
Vi Gal.Lowfat........ 99‘

According to McGuire’s 
figures, the present corn 
holding facility will hold 
7,200,000 pounds of com, 
which is enough corn for 
four and one half months 
production.
This will be the first major 

fuel alcohol plant in this 
area.

Also in Muleshoe, for the 
groundbreaking were Mike 
McGuire and Ron Tom- 
azweski, both of Charmec 
and Rim Geam, represent­
ing Tagco of Hereford, who 
will construct the new 
plant.

Sales...
Con’t from page 1

outlets in Parmer County 
said they had gross sales of 
$22,328,453 and deductions 
of $19,262,326. Use tax 
purchases for Parmer 
County were $62,123 and 
the amount subject to tax 
for Parmer County was 
$3,128,250.

Fourth quarter sales for 
Harris County were $19.7. 
billion, as reported by 
52.628 outlets, compared to 
sales of $14.1 billion in the 
third quarter.
Gross sales reported in the 

state’s other major urban 
areas included Dallas 
County. $10.7 billion, re­
ported by 39,128 outlets; 
Bexar County, $3 billion 
reported by 19,255 outlets 
and Tarrant County, $4.3 
billion reported by 19,910 
outlets.

FALLOUT & SERVICE
PASCO. WASH. 

Neither snow nor rain nor 
heat nor gloom of night may 
ever stay Postal Service 
couriers from their appointed 
rounds, but volcanic ash has. 
Postal deliveries have been 
stopped throughout eastern 
Washington and northern 
Idaho because of the fallout 
from Mount St. Helens. The 
planes, trains, trucks and 
buses that normally carry the 
mail have been halted.
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Have A HeartA lcohol Sym posium  

T o P robe P otentia l
An alcohol fuel sympos­

ium on "Small Scale Pro­
duction of Ethanol from 
Grain” is scheduled July 
1-2 at Texas A & M 
University.
Advance registration for 

the Symposium, to be held 
at the Rudder Theater, is 
underway now and will be 
accepted through June 23, 
says Spencer Tanksley, 
County Extension Agent. 
Registration is limited, and 
people are encouraged to 
register early by contacting 
the county Extension office 
for registration forms and 
more details.
"Many organizations of 

The Texas A & M Univer­
sity System -- including 
both the Texas Agricultural 
Experiment Station and 
Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service -  have joined 
forces to explore the vari­
ous aspects of the ethanol 
issues.” explained
Tanksley.
The symposium will pre­

sent latest information on 
feedstocks, preprocessing 
requirements, use as fuel in 
engines, by-product utili­
zation, and legal, economic 
and financial aspects of 
ethanol production.

Among speakers will be 
Dr. Neville P. Clark, Dir­
ector, Texas Agricultural

DIGGS RESIGNS
Rep. Charles C. Diggs, 

facing up to three years in 
prison on conviction of taking 
payroll kickbacks, has re­
signed from the House of 
Representatives. The Michi­
gan Democrat resigned 
"effective immediately" one 
day after the U.S. Supreme 
Court let his conviction stand 
by refusing to hear his 
appeal.

Experiment Station; Dr. 
Wayne A. LePori, Agri­
cultural Engineer, and Dr. 
E.J. Soltes, Reseacher in 
Wood Chemistry, both with 
the Experiment Station; 
and Henry P. O’Neal, 
Agricultural Engineer with 
the Extension Service.
Other speakers will in­

clude Reagan Brown. Texas 
Commissioner of Agricul­
tural and Representative 
Dan Kubiak, Vice Chair­
man, House Agricultural 
and Livestock Committe.

Serving as moderator will 
be Dr. Edward A. Hiller, 
Professor and Head, De­
partment of Agricultural 
Engineering at Texas A 
&M.
Joining the Experiment 

Station and Extension Ser­
vice in sponsoring the
two-day Symposium is 
A&M’s Center for Energy 
and Mineral Resources.

The American Heart 
Association carries on a 
national educational cam­
paign to create public 
awareness and recogni­
tion of the early signs of 
heart attack

Heart attack is the 
greatest killer in the 
United States (more than 
660,000 deaths annually). 
All should therefore be 
interested in the signs 
which give first indica­
tions of its approach.

The AHA says the 
most common are
(1) -Prolonged oppressive 
pain or discomfort in the 
center of the chest;
(2) -Pain radiation to the 
shoulder, arm, neck or 
jaw; (3)-Swcating accom­
panying the pain, perhaps 
nausea, vomiting or 
shortness of breath.

These symptoms, the 
AHA says, often subside 
and return at a later time. 
Those experiencing the 
symptoms should call a 
doctor at once.

The AHA specifies 
February as heart aware­
ness month. Executives 
between 35 and 64 are 
most vulnerable.

rfdom its  U nique
904SU /.6H  »

££ct us hedp pdan youft wedding!
Q idt oh foesh foomts 

Compete /reception catching!

Qcdd and Si&eA appointments 

^aidohed and drnjped cdoths
Qeautifod and delicious cates 

with hand nodded decohatious by Johnnie 
c3b/i mo he information cadd

272-3402 CDcmfo Dvq 265-3378

The heart 
o f an

energy efficient
hom e* ♦  4  is the way people feel who live in it.

Some of the new homes built today w ill save more energy than others Energy 
efficient homes (EEH) are built with tested and proven energy saving products 

and modern construction techniques

look for the Energy Efficient Home sign

Energy Efficient Homes are different because each has extra insulation added 
throughout the walls, floor, and attic They are built as structurally tight as possible 

to minimize air infiltration and leakage while maximizing energy savings

Consider ^stalling the energy saving heat pump for heating and cooling the home 
The heat pump operates efficiently by delivering more heat m winter than energy

used to produce it

People who live m Energy Efficient Homes save a lot to be happy about It’s good 
to know there are some things you can depend on
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îioussafid, Qamefit (jUa/i/iied cAlowe
Miss Rayniel Broussard 

became the bride of Nick 
Bamert at 7 p.m., Friday 
June 20, in Nome, Texas. 
Billy Sanders read the 
double ring vows.

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Brous­
sard of Nome and Mr. and 
Mrs. Carl Bamert of Mule- 
shoe.

The bride given in mar­
riage by her mother and 
father, Mr. and Mrs, Lee 
Broussard, wore a gown of 
white organza. The high 
neck, with a cameo insert 
and a sheer yoke was 
enhanced by a fitted bodice 
of chantilly lace, with tiny 
seed pearls. The sleeves 
were long and full. The full 
A-line skirt had a multi­

tiered lace flounce, which 
swept into a full chapel 
length train. She chose a 
matching camelot head- 
piece with a cathedral 
length veil of illusion, 
trimmed with chantilly 
lace. She carried a white 
cascading bouquet with 
pink sweetheart roses.
Vows were read before 

two brass candelabras de­
corated with greenery and 
white flowers.

Patsy Martel of Nome, 
served as maid of honor. 
Jeri and Ruby Broussard, 
sisters of the bride, of 
Nome, were bridesmaids. 
They wore identical floral 
formal length dresses of 
pink and burgandy, feat­
uring a flared skirt and

sheer capelet. The dresses 
were accented with a bur­
gandy bow. They carried a 
nosegay of white carnations 
and pink sweetheart roses.

Misty Hillin, niece of the 
groom, of Levelland, was 
flower girl. She wore a 
dress identical to those of 
the bridesmaids and wore 
pink silk flowers trimmed in 
burgandy in her hair.
The groom was attired in a 

white tuxedo, with a white 
ruffled shirt accented with 
a boutonniere of pink 
sweetheart roses.

Robert Martin, Muleshoe, 
was best man and Tommy 
St. Clair and Matt Phelps, 
all of Muleshoe, were the 
groomsmen. They were at­
tired in maroon tuxedoes

MRS. NICK BAMERT (nee Ravneil Broussard)

iTiuiicj u a u a  i  i un i
Ford!

Ford Motor Company will pay a cash 
rebate on the purchase of any new model 
according to the following schedule:
LTD Crown Victoria/Country Squire .......... ' $500
LTD— All other models............................... $400
LTD n .................................................... $400
Thunderbird— Silver Anniversary and 

Town Landau........................................ $500
Thunderbird—All other models.................... $300
Granada.......................................   $300
Fairmont...... ........................................$200
Pinto..................................................... $200
Mustang ............................................... $200
Fiesta.................................................... $10Q

Bronco's..............................................$1000

8 Cylinder Pickups..........................  $400

4 W heel Drive Pickups......................... $1000

Offer Expires July 12!

Muleshoe Motor Company
Car ( apitol O f The W est /*lainn 

1225 W. Anier. Bird. - * 2-4251

with a pink ruffled shirt. 
Reese Hillin, nephew of the 
groom of Levelland, was 
ring bearer. He wore a 
tuxedo identical to the 
groomsmen.

Nick Walraven, College 
Station, and Matt Phelps of 
Muleshoe, were the ushers. 
Nick was also attired in a 
maroon tuxedo with pink 
ruffled shirt.
Greta Hillin, sister of the 

groom of Levelland, sang 
“ We’ve Only Just Begun” 
and “ Always and
Forever". She wore a bur­
gandy formal length gown 
of crepe with pink silk 
flowers trimmed in bur­
gandy in her hair.
Mrs. Broussard, mother of 

the bride, chose a rose 
colored dress with a multi­
colored pink corsage. The 
groom's mother chose a 
formal length gown of 
mauve silk.
A reception followed in 

the fellowship hall. Guests 
were registered by Tammy 
Hawley. Sheri Hawley, 
Tina Hawley and Jeanie 
Couch served at the bride’s 
table. Karen Walraven and 
Janna St. Clair served at 
the groom’s table.
The bride’s table was 

skirted with burgandy taf- 
fata and an overlay of pink 
organza edged in bur­
gandy. A pink and bur­
gandy floral arrangement 
in a silver candelabra and a 
three tiered white cake with 
pink roses, accented the 
table. Silver appointments 
were used.

A maroon antique satin 
cloth covered the groom’s 
table. A brass coffee urn

and appointments were 
used. The sheet cake was 
topped with a miniature 
round cake decorated in 
shades of maroon and 
white.
After a wedding trip to 

Bermuda for ten days, they 
will reside at College Sta­
tion until graduation in 
May 1981. Then they will 
be at home in Muleshoe.
The bride is attending 

Texas A & M University, 
where she is majoring in 
Food Science and Tech­
nology. The groom is at­

tending Texas A & M 
University and is an Agri­
cultural major.

Out of town wedding 
guests included Mrs. Ollie 
Taylor and Mrs. Verona 
Bamert, Las Cruces, N.M., 
grandmothers of the groom 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Mar­
tin of Muleshoe and Mack 
Alexander of Levelland.
A rehearsal dinner was 

held June 19 at the Red 
Carpet Inn "f R',‘'« tr''n t, 
Texas. The dinner was 
hosted by the groom’s 
parents.

^yaijcs. Clements ^Voivs £*el»awjed
Paul Sneed recited nuptial The couple will be making

vows for Lynda Ann Hayes 
and Tomme Lynn Clements 
in a garden ceremony at the 
home of the bride’s parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Hayes in 
Amarillo on Saturday, June 
14.
The bridegroom is the son 

of Iris Clements and Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Clements of 
Muleshoe. He is the grand­
son of Madge Clements 
also of Muleshoe.

their home in Ruston, La. 
after a honeymoon trip to 
Santa Fe, N.M.

BRANDI LYNN BOMER

Words are the most pow­
erful drug used by 
mankind.

• Rudyard Kipling.

First Birthday 
Celebration

Brandi Lynn Bomer,
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Bomer, celebrated 
her first birthday June
17th. She has a brother, 
Shannon, five years of age.
Those helping her cele­

brate her birthday, other 
than her parents and 
brother were grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Sti- 
gaulle and Mr. and Mrs. 
Creston Faver.

A flaw in a piece of white 
jade may be ground 
away, but a word 
spoken amiss may not 
be called back.

Confucius.

For sunning and play, the 
romper for the little miss 
(size 4 lo 14) in soli cotton 
terrv is easy to care for In 
■ •».i oimrtier wihttv with col­
orful suspender sirups and 
fundings accent the romper

Fireworks!

WOMEN’S WORLD BOUTIQUE 
Features

Sizes 4-12 & 12Vi-50 
Dorcelle Leather Purses 

Snoopy Dolls

Karens Musical Clowns

Located By Caison’s B-B-Q 
In Hereford

828 W. 1st St. Ph. 364-1350
Hereford, T exas

SESS

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ A
*  
*  
*  
* 
* 
* 
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*  
*

Locations To 
Serve You

West Hwy 84 
&

North Hwy 214 

! ! Specials! !
700 asst. Packs $495 
1400 asst. Packs $995

» Buy 3 Bottle 
|  get 1 FREE
[ open June 24 thru July 4 
[ 2p.m. - 12p.m.

C 7  P  . A  N  T  M  O
I. ... <:A t - » » V .

321 MAIN OPEN 9 to 6 
"MULESHOE FRIENDLIEST STORE

s u p e r  s u m m e r

P0PSICLE, EXERCISERS 
AND BEACHC0MERS
$344

3 FOR

$io

Women's Dresses, Pants, 
Tops and Co-ordinales

20% t0 50%off
Get ready for Summer in a new wardrobe! 
This wide assortment includes dresses, 
blouses, pants and more, all at huge sav­
ings! Hurry in while the selection is best!

FAMOUS BRANDS

LADIES SLACKS & TOPS
regtol5. $ 7 9 7

JUNIOR SALE RACKS! 
$497 $ 797 $ 997

GIANT FABRIC CLEARANCE
GROUP l GR0UP2 GR0UP3

$ l 37 yd $l 77yd88* yd

Men's

Co-ordinates

3 3 % to 7 5 %
OFF

Get the executive look with 
this wide selection! A ll ore in

V light Spring ond Summer col­
ors. Coot sizes 36-46 regular 
ond long, slocks sizes 30-42.

’ ■ - ? Y: v -'

REDUCED NOW

MENS
DRESS SHIRTS

6 88 t o  8 8

FAMOUS BANDS

KNIT 
SHIRTS

088 AND
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MISS DONNA BENTLEY

Special Father’s Day
Friday afternoon, the men 

of the Nursing Home were 
honored with a special 
Father’s Day program. 
Terry Bouchelle of the Ave.

• Billy Joe Galvan
Mr. and Mrs. Vincent 

Galvan of Farwell are the 
proud parents of a new son 
born June 16. at 6:52 p.m. 
in the West Plains Medical 
Center. He weighed 8 lbs. 
and 1 ounce and has been 
named Billy Joe.
The young man has two 

sisters Veronica: three and 
one half, and Monica; one 
and one half years of age. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 

Mrs. Jose Galman of "Far- 
well and Mr. and Mrs. 
Buck Howe of Louisiana. 
Petra Galman of Farwell is 
a great grandparent.

Rayo Pevon Estrada
Mr. and Mrs. Guillermo 

Estrada are the proud par­
ents of a new daughter, 
Rayo Pevon, born June 17, 
at 4:33 p.m. She weighed 7 
lbs. and 5 ounces.

“ Q/tand p a m is  " 
QSaby Shorn 
‘JWono/ts Cook's

Mr. and Mrs. Marshall 
Cook were honored with a 
‘‘Grandparents’’ baby 
shower Thursday, June 5 in 
the parlor of the Methodist 
Church. This will be the 
first grandchild for Mr. and 
Mrs. Cook.
The prospective parents 

are Mr. and Mrs. James 
Cook, who live in the Ft. 
Worth area.

Hostesses for the occasion 
were; Lela Ann Smith, 
Joyce Albertson. Betty 
Clayton. Mattie Hicks. 
Johnny Parker, Bobbie 
Bryant. Virginia Shultz, 
Ada Murrah, Marsha Rasco 
Ivanell Carlson, Arelia 
Morris, Evelyn Ziegenfuss, 
Norma Prather, Jackie 
Maritt, Jo Blackwell, and 
Pat Holland.

V
w
in find
m

OuA

. BATONS
• ANNOUNCIMfNTS *

. NAPKINS ^

• MlDAt SOOK

• Accrssotus

D Church of Christ read a 
Father’s Day poem and 
lead several songs.

Maggie Rennels of Chan­
nel 6 TV interviewed Char­
lie Garth, Ed Parks, A.M. 
Bradley and W.W. Parker 
and she took their picture 
and put it on Cable TV.

A boutonniere was given 
to each father. The oldest 
father was Charlie Garth, 
who is 92 years of age. The 
youngest was W.W. Parker 
72 years of age.
The flowers were given by 

Decorators. The Hospital 
and Nursing Home Aux. 
helped sponsor the pro­
gram. Refreshments of 
home made ice cream, a 
decorated Father’s Day 
cake, cookies and punch 
were served to all the 
residents and visitors.

t t

Miss Donna Bentley, 
bride elect of Rickey Hayes 
was honored with a bridal 
shower Thursday, June 19, 
at 7:30 p.m. in the Bailey 
County Coliseum banquet 
room.
Guests were greeted by 

the honoree and het mother 
Mrs. Don Bentley, and the 
prospective groom’s 
mother, Mrs. John Hayes.
The serving table was 

covered with a white lace 
trimmed tablecloth. A silk 
floral arrangement in the 
bride's chosen colors, 
peach and white, accented 
the table. Her corsage was 
peach and white fresh car-

TOPS Has 
Weekly Meeting

The TOPS Club met at 6 
p.m. Thursday, in the 
meeting room of Bailey 
County Electric. Carlene 
Stroud, leader, opened the 
meeting with the TOPS 
song and pledge. Linda 
Vinson, weight recorder, 
called the roll, with 19 
members present. Vickie 
Garner read the minutes, 
they were approved.

Best loser for the week 
was Rose Sain, Brenda 
Murphy was first runner-up 
and Randy Redwine was 
second runner-up. May 
Provence received material 
for three consecutive weeks 
weight loss. Nan Gatlin had 
a birthday and received a 
gift from the birthday box.
It was reported that Sue 

Murphey was in the High­
land Hospital in Lubbock 
after an accident on a 
motorcycle.
Mona Spencer, TOPS co­

ordinator from Plainview, is 
expected to be here July 10. 
The meeting was dismissed 
with the singing of the 
goodnight song.

nations.
Special guests included 

Mrs. John Hayes, mother 
of the prospective groom, 
Mrs. Don Bentley, mother 
of the bride, Debra Beene, 
sister of the groom, Mrs. 
Steve Marshall, sister of 
the bride and Mrs. Travis 
Bentley, sister-in-law of the

bride.
The hostesses gifts were 

four place settings of 
dishes. Hostesses for the 
occasion were LaVayne 
Williams, Linda Mullin, 
Betty Campbell, Betty 
Bruns, Edith Wilt, Mrs. 
Lonnie Merriott, Mrs. 
James O’Gradv. Mrs. Gor­

don Wilson, Mrs. James L 
Brown, Mrs. Francis Gil 
breath, Mrs. Clark McCa 
mish, Mrs. Richard Rutner 
Mrs. Butch Vandiver, Mrs 
Joe Rhodes, Mrs. Kenneth 
Powell and Mrs. Claude 
Holmes.

4K*

Progressive 
Home Club

MR. AND MRS. CECIL DAVIS

Oma Stratton entertained 
the Progressive Homes 
Club Wednesday, with five 
members present. Norene 
Thomas, president, presid­
ed over the meeting. Sec­
retary, Roxie Hoover, 
called the roll, which was 
answered with hints, tips 
and a poem given by Vera 
Engleking entitled, “ Just 
Like His Dad". The trea­
surer’s report was by Vera 
Engleking.
Roxie Hoover drew the 

hostess gift. After the fel­
lowship, refreshments were 
served to Vera Engleking, 
Norene Thomas, Roxie 
Hoover, Wenona Gibson, 
by the hostess, Oma 
Stratton.

W.W. PARKER CHARLIE GARTH

Lazbuddie Young Homemakers
The Lazbuddie Young 

Homemakers held their 
regular meeting in May to 
elect new officers for the 
1980-81 year. Elected were: 
Mandi Seaton, President; 
Cindy Cargile, Vice-Presi­
dent; Cindy Hall, Secretary 
-Treasurer; Marca Morris, 
Historian; and Sheryl En- 
gelking. Reporter.
The Young Homemakers 

also hosted a coke party for

Q o Q d e n  Q J e a t e  C M i t a t e d  Q f y  A/t l Q hc( <j U / i s  Q ) a v f s

MR. AND MRS. MARSHALL COOK

Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Davis 
were honored with a re­
ception in honor of their 
50th wedding anniversary 
Sunday, June 15, in the 
fellowship hall of the 
Methodist Church. 
Approximately 425 friends 

and relatives from eight 
states; California, Colorado 
New Mexico, Texas, Or- 
egan, Vermont, Arkansas 
and Kansas; signed the 
register. Melva said, “ The 
425 friends and relatives 
helped to make their 50th 
anniversary a most won­
derful experience.”

All of the relatives wore

ChMdcrns
Home
Associates

The Portales Christain 
Children Home Associates 
met at Modine Elmore's 
home, with six members 
and a visitor present. The 
members present were; 
Lillie Barnhouse, Edith St. 
Clair, Ethel Julian, Ruth 
Williams. Oneta Cornelson, 
and Modine Elmore. Bettie 
Cox visited. Hot rolls, but­
ter, honey, cake, jello, ice 
cream, tea and lemonaid 
were served.

Deliver your words not by 
num ber. but by 
weight.

-H.G Bohn.

tags that designated which 
one (Cecil or Melva) were 
their relative. Mr. and Mrs. 
David Ware and family 
were special guests.

Davis came to Muleshoe 
in 1920 from Byers, Texas. 
He was a farmer and ran­
cher for 60 years. Mrs. 
Davis came to Muleshoe, 
along with her parents, the 
late Mr. and Mrs. G.T. 
Gues in 1928 from Post, 
Texas. They farmed seven 
miles northwest of Mule- 
Shoe.
Cecil Davis and Melva 

Gues attended high school 
together, her junior and his 

^senior year. They were 
married June l§, 1930 in 
Clovis. N.M«*-

They made their home in 
The Fairview Community, 
eight miles south of Mule­
shoe until 1964, when they

moved to Muleshoe, after 
his retirement from farm­
ing and ranching. Although 
he was semi-retired he was 
a book keeper for five or six 
years. He was Bailey 
County Chairman of the 
Historical Committee for 15. 
years. He is a member of 
the Lubbock Heritage Or­
ganization and a Mason, 
where he is Master Mason 
of the Masonic Lodge. Both 
Mr. and Mrs. Davis are 
members of Eastern Star. 
He was also a Director of 
Production Credit Associ­
ation for nine consecutive 
years and served on various 
other gin and elevator

* boards.
* Mr. and Mrs. Davis have

attended the Methodist 
Church all of their married 
life and served on the 
official board many years.

Also various other com­
mittees of the church. She 
has been active in the 
women’s work of the 
church and sang in the 
choir- for over 30 years. 
They are still active mem­
bers of the rhiirch.

the FHA girls, thanking 
them for babysitting during 
the meetings.
There will be a summer 

meeting, but the date has 
not been set. Secret Pals 
will continue through the 
summer and will be reveal­
ed next fall.

Members are: LaReta
Barber, Janice Bradshaw, 
Vickie Burch, Cindy Cargile 
Marsha Collum, Sheryl En­
gleking, Ellen Gallman, 
Cindy Hall, Joann McDon­
ald, Debbie Magby, Billie 
Mason, Reta Mimms, Jen­
ny Mitchell, Marca Morris, 
Debbie Nickels, Debbie 
Redwine, Charlotte Red- 
wine, Rickie Seaton, Mandi 
Seaton, Debbie Smith, Nel­
lie Vise and Debbie Weir.

Just when you thought it tuts sale 
k> go hack in the water...

Terror comes again to the resort town that can never forget 
JAWS' JAWS 2 "...unbelievable, incredible, terrifying, 

starring Roy Scheider.

Special Insinuation Vev for June- 

TELEVISION WORTH PAYING FOR"

•  •A n n o u n c i n g

Free Interest On Tractors!

From Now Until Oct 31,1980  
ALL Tractors Sold Will rm
Be Financed FreeBy 
I.H. Until March 1,19811

BUYNOW ! r
f. I

■II

ec2£=x

f .

In Addition!
Our Plan,  

Hay Equipment
&  /

Our Long Term ' ‘

Lease Program Is 
Eligible For Waiver Of Finance 

Charges!
Come In & See Bill Harmon Or Bill Wooley Today!

W  o o l e y - H u r s t ,  I n c .
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Alcohol Fuel From Biomass Can 
Help Ease Liquid-Fuel Demand
By Robert L. Haney 
TAtS Science Writer

Alcohol fuel, manufac­
tured from agricultural bio­
mass. can help ease our 
present problems with liquid 
fuels In fact, this may be our 
brightest short-term hope un­
til we develop the technology 
to fully utilize our massive 
energy reserves in coal, lig­
nite. shale oil, solar, and 
other options, according to 
research leaders at Texas 
A&M University.

"A crash pmgram in syn­
thetic liquid-fuel production 
is a slated objective of the U. 
S. government, further en­
couraged by tax breaks." says 
Dr. Edward A llilcr. head of 
the Department of Agricul­
tural Engineering and leader 
of the Alcohol Fuels Program 
at Texas A&M

The President's recently- 
announced gasohol program 
for IU80-1lN0 establishes a 
goal of 500 million gallons of 
alcohol fuel capacity to be in 
place in l‘)S|. About HO 
million gallons of annual 
on-line capacity currently 
exists: 420 million gallons of 
additional capacity must be 
added this ycai and next to 
reach the President's goal.

"As a rcsiilt of this encour­
agement. the Fxpcriment Sta­
tion and Kxtension Service 
are besieged by thousands of 
inquiries from purchasers of 
small alcohol-manufacturing 
units, with problems, or pro­
spective buyers," llilcr says.

"The truth is that at 
present we can't answer some

ol these questions, and nei­
ther tan anyone else! Only 
added research can provide 
these much needed answers

"It is evident to us that 
a large national commitment 
to ethanol production using 
grain as the only feedstock 
will inevitably lead to a 
food/fuel crisis.

"It is also certain that, 
initially, grain will have to he 
the major feedstock lor etha­
nol production because 
knowledge is lacking for feed­
stocks other than grains.

"The feedstock accounts 
for roughly two-thirds of the 
operating cost. Since grain 
prices will probably rise in 
the future, systems need to 
be able to handle alternate 
feedstocks, as well."

A very basic problem, for 
example, has been encount­
ered by owners of small alco­
hol units, in finding that the 
product runs between IbO 
and I‘>0 proof.

This means, it also has 
water in it and cannot be suc­
cessfully hlended as is with 
gasoline or diesel to make 
gasohol or dicsclhol. Further 
expensive distillation is re­
quired to attain 200 proof 
alcohol, which can be 
blended.

Research is urgently need­
ed. Ililer says, in these major 
areas:

First, is the determination 
ol pre-processing require­
ments for non-grain feed­
stocks. Specific crops offering 
piomisc in this area include, 
among many others, sweet 
sorghum, sugar cane, sugar 
beets, sweet potatoes, and

cull fruits and vegetables.
At present, no one knows 

enough about needed adjust­
ments in the fermentation 
and distillation operations 
and quality of stillage for 
animal feeding, when such 
materials are used.

Second, more information 
is needed about costs of alco­
hol made from these various 
feedstocks. This includes se­
lecting a mix of feedstocks 
to take advantage of low cost 
and seasonal availability and 
determining the production 
cost tor various alternatives.

Costs and annual hours of 
operation needed in ordei to 
get a proper return on invest­
ment must be deteimined.

Third, in order to avoid 
stillage drying, which uses 
laige quantities of energy, 
cattle-feeding operations may 
have to convert to stillage- 
based rations. These are high­
er in moisture content than 
conventional grain rations.

Research is needed to fmd 
out the quantity and nutri­
tional quality of various stil­
lages that animals can con­
sume, feed processing alterna­
tives. degree of dewatering 
needed before feeding, and 
storage alternatives.

Fourth, since alcohol pro­
duction plants will pmducc 
wastes if the stillage is not 
disposed of immediately (and 
it is yet to be determined if 
all the stillage can be fed).
work may be needed to devel­
op environmentally sound 
disposal systems.

Fifth, a very important 
area of research is the use of 
ethanol in internal combus­

tion engines. Particular em­
phasis should he placed on its 
use in diesel engines since 
these arc most important in 
agricultural production sys­
tems. Vaporization of the 
ethanol and use hi natural gas 
engines also has much prom 
ise.

Sixth, sweet sorghum has 
been widely acclaimed as an 
ideal feedstock for alcohol 
production because of its 
high yields, high sugar con­
tent. and wide area of adapta­
tion.

However, methods of har­
vesting. handling, and pie- 
processing the crop in small- 
scale systems have not been 
demonstrated.

Seventh, biomass combus­
tion or gasification potential­
ly can he used to produce 
the process heat lor operation 
of an alcohol system. Woik in 
progress at the Texas Agricul­
tural Experiment Station has 
shown that biomass can be 
combusted successfully in 
small processing units.

In order to hold down 
costs, such equipment needs 
to be interfaced with an alco­
hol systen^

This could substitute a 
low-grade fuel for high-grade 
fuels such as natural gas or 
fuel oil piesently used in 
small systems and would coil- 
sideiahly improve both eco­
nomic return and energy bal­
ance for small-scale plant 
operations.

Figlilh. in order io insure 
safety to operators and ad- 
joining property, procedures 
need to be developed for con­
struction and operation of 
small-scale systems. Alcohol 
is flammable and can be dan­
gerous if proper procedures 
aie not followed. A prolifera­
tion of stills designed and

HOME RAZED BY EXPLOSION,FIRE....Shortly after 12:30 a.m. Friday, the home of Ed Flaskins at Progress was 
leveled by an explosion and fire. The force of the explosion blew glass, window screens and window frames into a field 
and across the street from the home. Haskins managed to escape from the house just before it exploded. He said he 
woke up and discovered the house was burning. He was not injured. * * * *  ,* * *

• * * * * * * * XIMoney is only one in-
Smart people don’t do Petty honors feed the gredient of life’s secret of

all the talking. ____ ego of complexes. happiness. science

Fear is kin to both 
envy and a guilty con-

Don't Let The Southwestern Corn 
Borer & Sorghum Insects

Rob You Of Profits
Don \  let your corn be a pushover for 

southwestern corn borer. Get effective control with 
liquid SEVIMOL 4 carbarylinsecticide. SEVIMOL 4 

is your economical answer to southwestern corn borer 
and other corn and sorghum pests. It 'sthe liquid 
formulation ofSEVIN. .. the insecticide that's been 
working hard for farm profits for 20 years. See us for 
more information.

STOP! ALL PESTICIDES CAN BE HARMFUL TO 
HE A LTH AND THE EN VIR ONMENT IF MIS USED 
READ THE LABEL CAREFULL YAND USE ONL Y 

AS DIRECTED

S E V I M O L ’
R iverside Chem ical Co.

* Hwv 84

constructed by inexperienced 
persons could result in many 
serious accidents.

Ninth, environmental im­
pacts resulting Irem ethanol 
production in small-scale sys­
tems need to be assessed.

"The foregoing is only a 
partial and simplified listing 
of problems associated with 
production of alcohol from 
biomass.” said Dr. Neville 
Clarke. Director of the Texas 
Agricultural 1 xperiment Sta­
tion. "and we’re already 
working on a number of 
litem.

"Research in the area of 
alcohol production will likely 
l>e a continuing function of 
the Texas Agricultural I xper­
iment Station.

"We expect to become a 
( enter of excellence m this 
research area and to that 
end have developed a broad- 
based research program under 
llilei s leadership that mar­
shalls the scientific resources

of The Texas A&M University 
System.

"Much loo long to detail 
there, this broad-based re­
search will center on the Ag­
ricultural Experiment Station 
with the active support of the 
Agricultural Extension Ser­
vice, Texas Engineering Ex­
periment Station, and the 
Center for Energy and Miner­
al Resources of The Texas 
A&M University System.

"External support from
the Texas Energy and Natural 
Resources Advisory Council, 
as well as private industry, is 
being sought to expedite this 
vital program.

"This research is expected 
to rapidly develop needed 
answers to problems associat­
ed with fuel production from 
agricultural biomass. This 
State has the potential to 
virtually tree itself insolar-as 
agriculture is concerned, of 
most of its dependency on 
petrochemicals." Clarke con-

Geothermal Energy Stored
Proposed changes in the 

federal ‘‘Emergency Build­
ing Temperature Restric­
tions” program (EBTR) 
would give building mana­
gers greater flexibility in 
conserving energy, it was 
announced by the U.S. 
Department of Energy to­
day.
Under an alternate plan, 

building owners would be 
permitted to cool their 
buildings to 74 degrees 
Fahrenheit, rather than the 
present 78 degrees. In win­
ter the temperature could 
be upped to 68 degrees, 
rather than the current 65 
degrees.
The proposed regulations 

would permit a building 
manager to use an alternate 
plan, if that plan would 
achieve an energy savings 
equal to that resulting from 
full compliance with the 
current regulations. The 
current regulations remain 
in force until final rules are 
published this summer.

Actions that could be ta­
ken include reducing light­
ing wattage, changing

hours of building opera­
tions, installing insulation 
and weatherization, among 
others. The proposed reg­
ulations were published in 
the Federal Register on 
May 27, 1980. A 30-day 
public comment period 
ends on June 26. 1980.

Other changes and clar­
ifications would affect se­
nior citizens' centers, 
school, work place show 
and changing rooms, and 
circumstances where work­
ers who are required to 
wear special or protective 
clothing may be endanger­
ed by the temperature re­
gulations.

Further information about 
the proposed changes may 
be obtained by writing the 
EBTR Office (CE). De­
partment of Energy, P.O. 
Box 35228, Dallas. Texas 
75235. The telephone num­
ber is (214) 767-7777.
General information about 

the program may be ob­
tained by telephoning the 
toll-free emergency con­
servation service hotline 
number in Washington. 
D.C., at 1-800-424-4122.

eluded.
An alcohol-fuel sympo­

sium ji Texas A&M Universi­
ty, July 1-2. will review pre- 
scni technology, problems, 
and potential of production 
of ethanol from grain and 
other agricultural products. 
Sponsors are the Texas Agri­
cultural Experiment Station, 
the Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, and the Center 
for Energy and Mineral Re­
sources. Meeting starts at

Bad Weather 
Kills Peaches

AUSTIN—Due to freezing 
temperatures and hail which 
destroyed much ol the lexas 
peach crop this spring, total 
production ol the favored 
Iruit is expected to reach only 
250.000 bushels this season, 
down 6"! percent Irom a year 
ago.

Agriculture Commissioner 
Reagan V brown reported
that l ast l exas growers were 
among the lew who escaped 
the devastating effects ol 
spring storms. Production in 
Central lexas. the states 
major growing area, was lost 

complete!) in main orchards 
(irowers report that Gillespie 
County peaches will be sold 
loculi) bill will not he 
shipped.

Considerable losses also 
occurred in North lexas and 
on (he High Plains where cold 
Ironts caught trees in lull 
bloom

i) \o a m . July i amJ ends at
„ July 2: for more 

information call your local 
research and extension cen­
ter your county agent, or
Gary A rn o ld . College Station. 
TeJ. 713/845-2211.
Editor’s Note: Any questions 
regarding this column should 
be addressed to Science Writ­
er, Department o f Agricultur­
al Communications, Texas 
A AM University, College Sta­
tion, Texas 77843.

BIBLE VERSE
"T h e  kingdom  of 

heaven is like unto a grain 
o f mustard seed, which a 
man took, and sowed in 
his field.

1. Where is this verse 
found?
2. Who spoke these 
words?
3. W here were they 
spoken?
4. Is this parable found 
elsewhere in the Bible?

Aiuwers To Bible Verse
1. Matthew 13:31.
2. Jesus.
3. From a boat by the 
seaside.
4. See Mark 4:30 and 
Luke 13:19.

Philosophy may teach us 
to bear with eq u a­
nimity the misfortunes 
of our neighbors.

-Oscar Wilde.

Three W heel W e e d  Killer
H O N D A  A T C 110

w ith  spray rig
>  *

Cycle Gty
6523Ave.H (Tahoka Hwy.) Open 6 days weekly 
Lubbock, Texas 806-745-5070

Classified Ads 
offer ServiciSpecialists

Whatever your service needs are, you're sure to find 
the specialist in the Classifieds at reasonable rates.

R e a d  t h e  C la s s if ie d s  t o d a y !

The Muleshoe & Bailey County

Journals
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S u d a n  N e w g

By Evelyn Ritchie

Amy Beckett has been 
here from M idland to visit 
her aunts and families, 
Mr. and M rs. Dewayne 
Powell and Mr. and Mrs. 
Butch Hall. Her grand- 

| 0 mother, M rs. Arnold
Bechett, has been in the 
Muleshoe and Lubbock 
hospitals recently.

*****

Mrs. Bruce Newman, 
Bonnie and Ten?. Newman 
spent the week with Rev. 
and Mrs. Bob Netherland

ly a n d  children in M idland.

Mr. and Mrs. M .H. Tol- 
lett have been in Beau­
mont to attend graduation 
exercises for their g rand­
son, Raymond Shafer. 

*****
Mrs. Arnold Becket is a 

| |  medical patient in the 
Methodist Hospital in
Lubbock.

*****

David Doty and Crystal 
of Littlefield visited d u r­
ing the weekend with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne Doty and other 
relatives.

Rev. Kerry Hurst a t­
tended the Northwest 
Texas conference of the 
United M ethodist Church 
in Abilene last week. Cliff 
Stephens also attended 
the conference as a dele­
gate from the local
church.

*****

F.M . Smith is a surgical 
patient in the M ethodist 
Hospital in Lubbock.

Rev. Kerry Hurst has 
been in Abilene to attend 
tfie Northwest Texas An- fa., ual Conference of the 
M ethodist Church. His 
wife and son visited in 
Tahoka with her parents 
while he was gone. Hurst 
was re-appointed tS'.IBe 
M ethodist Church here for 
another year.

Son Qualls has been 
visiting his sister in Little­
field.

*****

Mrs. Jerry Ray was one 
of the sponsors for the 
senior trip to South Padre 
Island. While there, her 
daughter, Vicki Williams 
of Edinburgh met them 
there for a visit.

* * * * *

Twilla Rudd has returned 
home from college and is 
employed at the denim 
plant in Littlefield.

*****

Mrs. J.W. Olds visited in 
Lubbock this week with her 
daughter, Melba Bauldin. 

*****
Linda Murrell of Shreve­

port, La. visited recently 
with her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Lane and her 
sister, Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Nix and children.

*****
Mrs. J.W . Olds was in 

Plainview last Sunday to 
attend a wedding reception 
for Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Bouldin.

**•••
Georgia Newcomes re­

turned to her home in 
Houston Tuesday following 
a visit here with her parents 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Ray 
and Tanya and her sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roby Lynn 
and Jennifer.

*****
Among those from Sudan 

who have been in the 
Amherst hospital recently 
are Dorothy Handley, El­
bert Rasco, Griff Boyles, 
Hazel Savage and Ray 
Wood.

*****
Recently visiting with Mr. 

and Mrs. Ray May and 
Raegon were Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Hamilton, Chesa and 
Jason of Great Falls, Mon­
tana.

Mr. and M rs. Bob Sum­
mer and Shelia have been 
in Munday for summer 
harvest for the past few
days.

Herring of Lubbock attend­
ed with Mrs. Vereen. Ber­
tha Vereen. Mrs. J. W. 
Olds and Mrs. Rodney 
Nichols also the attended 
the Howard and Henson 
wedding.

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Nic­
hols are home after an 
extended stay on Lake Fal­
con.

*****
Mark Lane, senior and 

biomedical science major at 
West Texas State Univer­
sity has been named to the 
president's list with a 4.0 
average. He is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Lane.

*****
Lisa Harper, Bert Byerley, 

Keith Downa and Laura 
Beene have been named to 
Texas Tech Dean's honor 
list for the spring semester.

*****
Recently visiting Mr. and 

Mrs. Charles Logan have 
been their son Cary of 
Amarillo, their daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Hunter 
and children also of Ama­
rillo. Their grandson. Ben 
Logan has been here also 
for a visit.

Faye Dorsey recently re­
turned home from visiting
friends in Carlsbad. N.M. 

*****

Mary Powell and June 
Bartley have been attend­
ing a lunch room workers 
school this week in Lub­
bock.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Bonner 
Markham of Amarillo visit­
ed during the weekend with 
his parents. Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Burt Markham and 
their son. Chip, returned 
home with them following a 
week’s stay here with his
grandparents.

*****

Hayt Robertson has been 
fishing recently at Lake 
Brown wood.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Wells 

were in Abernathy Sunday 
to visit their daughter, 
Mary Wieliford, Rose and 
Rita.

Mr. and Mrs. A.B.Knox
returned home Wednesday
from a fishing trip.

*****
Mrs. W.T. Vereen at­

tended the wedding Satur­
day for her grandson. 
Tommy Henson and
Barbara Howard in Little­
field. Mr. and Mrs. Rex

■ -■ i - v

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Day have been their 
daughters. Mrs. Robert Pi- 
land of Wichita Falls. Mr. 
and Mrs. Jack Noblett of 
Lubbock and other family 
members. It was reported 
that Mrs. Day is progres­
sing very well.

'K
f

Attention all band mem­
bers: If you have not turned 
in your band uniform, it is 
most urgent that you do so 
immediately, along with a 
cleaning ticket. These may 
be turned in to Mrs. Connie 
Hill.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Larry 
Schweppe of Sorento, 111. 
are parents of a new son, 
Joseph Kyle born at 2:55 
p.m. Tuesday. June 10 
Joseph Kyle weighed six 

pounds, thirteen ounces 
and was 20 inches long. 
Grandparents are Mr. and 

Mrs. G.C. Churchman of 
Sudan and Mr. and Mrs. 
Joseph Wargola of New 
Douglas. 111.
The infant has a three and 

one half year old brother, 
Larry Dean.

*****
Happy Birthday Dorothy 

Drake!!!
*****

Mr. and Mrs. D.W. Wil­
liamson have been vaca­
tioning at Lake Graham. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 

Rogers visited recently in 
Midland with her sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. B.L. Ander­
son.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Drake 

visited recently in Tulia 
with relatives.

Cheryl Phillips and Gay- 
lene Rogers left Tuesday 
for Nashville, Tenn. where 
they will attend musicals 
and tour points of interest. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. B.A. Beau­

champ, Jr.. Derwin, Sharon 
Vickers and girls and Sher­
ry Capers and Rebecca 
were in Muleshoe Wednes­
day evening for a dinner in 
honor of the Beauchamp's 
anniversary in the home of 
her sister, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Black.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. A.C. Baker, 

Cedric and Eric of Arling- 
cto/T^fite been visiting her 

parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ed 
King and family.

*****

Mrs. Ida Mae Beauchamp 
is visiting in Lubbock with 
her daughter.

*****

Martin Maxwell has been 
a patient in the Littlefield

RIBBON CUTTING HELD.... Members of the Red Coats from Muleshoe Chamber of Commerce and Agricultural were 
at Pay and Save Grocery Thursday afternoon for a ribbon cutting ceremony and to congratulate the local grocery store 
on their newly remodeled and expanded store. Also presented was ‘The First Dollar of Profit’ for the store in the new 

quarters.

Philosophy goes no fur­
ther than probabili­
ties, and in every as­
sertion keeps a doubt 
in reserve.

-J.A. Froudc.

A little philosophy causes 
men to despise learn­
ing, but much philos­
ophy makes them 
esteem it.

•Nicholas Chamfort.

S i m p l e  &  Q u ic k

r

./.. the 
24 hour 

bank
SSS -

GAS0H0L 
IS HERE
and we have it!

Joe Long’s
Central Texaco

2 2 1  W . A in er*  B lv d .

hospital.
*****

Mr. and Mrs. Claud 
Kropp spent Father’s Day 
with their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. John Kropp, Sonny 
and Blue and other family 
members.

*****
Mrs. Gene Corley and Jim 

of Belen, N.M. visited re­
cently with her sister-in-law 
Mr. and Mrs. G.C. Ritchie.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Nelson 
returned from the lake re­
cently.

*****
Monte Rogers of Houston 

arrived home Thursday for 
a visit with his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne Rogers. 
They all visited in Wheeler 
with relatives prior to going 
to Colorado for a few days 
vacation.

*****

Mrs. Sharon Vickers, 
Kristie and Amy of Mans­
field. Ohio and Mrs. Sherry 
Capers and Rebecca of 
Cadiz, Ohio will return 
Monday to their homes 
following a visit here with 
their parents and grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. B.A. 
Beauchamp. Jr. and 
Derwin.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Claud 
Kropp visited recently in 
Hereford and Amarillo with 
their children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Mincheu and 
boys and Mr. and Mrs.
Troy Waller and children. 

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Jack En- 

gram were in Amarillo dur­
ing the weekend to attend 
the wedding of their grand­
son, Mickey Popejoy.

START SUMMER
WITH SOME GREAT SAVINGS 

FROM A & M .........

i
omgiuooeneotediKJi 
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• Cynndw locking >ec»*v
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SPECIAL.

Cross Over 
Tool 
Boxes
n m  m m .
MUM KIM
COMPACT PICKUPS

C o rd le ss tr im m in g ?
Drop in for a look at the Toro cordless 
trimmer Lets you trim where exten­
sion cords won t reach It s got the 
power to do those tough trimming 
lobs under tences and around trees 
or shrubs The banery pack lets you 
trim for up to 45 minutes before re­
charging Weighs only 7 pounds so it 
won’t tire you out It hasToro’s unique, 
fultv-aulomatk: line feed so you don t 
have to stop and feed out line by hand

lOUNT1Shear-kingMOD. 5503
A Ivgh p**l< 
»i big yard 
cover, evei 
motor clear 
•hen you t, 
protects yo 
guard trm; 
duty cultxtg 
you hrm. tw, 
insulated Ira

•si ce trxnmer with the muscle to handle lough cuttxrg chores 
t ms. edges, sweeps scalps tnms your ivy wtd ground 

id. 3 up kght hedges A powerful V. HP Permanent Magnet 
. fu i 15 path Fresh cultxtg cord feeds out AUTOMATICALLY 

It head against the ground The sturdy wr«> wound guard 
•io t (lying debris, and an automatic cord cutlet buXt xito the 
* '  ''d to perfect cutting length The reel holds 5 0  ft ot heavy 
>i and it s easy to replace Husky, comfortable handles give 
. 1 control (or trxnmxtg xi any plane The entxe unit is double 
ii .alety

(EG. 42.50

A'

SPECIAL

mi

Toro cordless trimm.

REG. 57.15 
SPECIAL

Haven't you done without 
a Toro long enough? ,M

GOOD THRU 
SATURDAY 
JUNK 28th

Murray Tractors Make Short 
Work Of Big Lawn Care Jobs!

<i
i *

i

• 11 H.P. Briggs & Stratton 
Synchro Balanced

•  38” Cut
g Headlight & Electric Start 
g Convenient Height Adjustment- 
g Easy On, Easy Off Golf Cart Design 
g Maximum Maneuverability

0-3667
SAVE 
200.31 
0 3447 $774 00

Air Cooled m n# Driven

(H f  S I L I N C W E L D E R ’ 2 2 5 |
DC Portoblo r< Voider With AC Powor Capacity...
fN( kkal union

* r tenafx* Gep«r 
w*V» a h.fhfy | 
•ktr t>on o* repast a * 

|<K 1*005 »rf rnv 
DC RMd*wg Output 

fo*v'eet tow hydro* 
•ng Hectrodex 
21%

rtraclors * .ft and factory 
•xetd'hg shop* and other* 
••At ruee for erection pro
vde and out wtw*v poor' 
EVAilAb'*-

tmended the best »rc 
lion welding «t*th mild 
.* *teei end hard turtAC

<% ervH.; ’or geneui purpose

mid Meet eietirodr* and the s>" w e  of ai type*

AC Pweer Output of 1000 watts 115 volts 50 hetli 
continuous duty t* plenty of power »o* lights End 
tao‘% needed at wttdng site*

Preote Control #1 Current end yoitagr efi the
operator select iu*t the heat and r i  t •'ar*det.*t.M 
needed tor every pb

Arr Cooled f ngm* .* light «nd ro* i>a<l tt ia>*1 ability Mw initial machine cos*
natiiti um

OMAR S UPf O
THACTlMO.it A COtMfO rNttftl

menu#' choke *0*

■gototn** u *»r 
■•ng sexvir 
*'»e a-r't'P'’

l&ICUMARTI* • p
■ • OA**#'•** am.

i «tty engetf
! peed GAG* <w* •

t t'oweo*’

CURRENT RANCIMl It TOR .* t.vr
ii*t CM'** (u "e t 
adiustme*-* R-r>*»\ 

ow so sn 
*'• no b»«*d spots

TWIN MumfRS

DU A l ns VOM* 
RfCfFTAClC*

CURRENT AN0OCVFINI AOJUSTfeMNT RHtOSTAT
selects 4" iha'Attet 
•s'<tandM*t!hFel 
••th.n eorh Mnjft needed 
to* **•■* ippt*. »««*

"torn C OR T RO(S
lurUteri on r nn«r0 
P* V  tO» iMi'tsue

Lightweight and easy to u se .. .  it is 
ideal for small yards and precise trimming

P A R A M O U N T Shear-lung moo 5205

L RTf (HAWING
> on |0O**ep pns twi

'TONA! ewfURMIC N vm$RCARRW**
or v.tetnct>*'*r

t T ■

Me*, s a* the versatility and safety of nylon c o rd  trm m x ig  lor 
people w l h  smaller yards o< * h o  live m hater perks or condominiums 

W e g h x ig  less than 1 l b s . it *  so easy to control that nearly anyone 

can use a II will cleai out grass and kgM w eeds along fences and 
•lower beds around trees and under stxubs a* those a w k w a'd  places 

your lawn m ower can I reach *  sturdy w rap around guard protects 

yo u  from IlyXHj dehns With a 2 0  hp motor it cuts a lull 9 « c h  
oath 1 h e  cutting co rd  *  m ta n lly  adtustabie without tools and 
the spool holds ?•* II ot spare c o rd  Replacem ent spools are easy 

to instae The bsj co ntoured  hanr*e tils th t hand perfectly 
and leatu-es a co nren m nt O n  O tr trigger switch Th e  enure 
o n !  ,s double  insulated tor your satety and to permit the use 

of Itqhler thfifiipr l  wife cords

CUTS 
A FULL

PATH

REG. 19.75 

SPECIAL

9 9

S 1J

V v 1764.00 
Si ECIAL 11625

•T O R I HOURS

7 :3 0  A M  • 5 :3 0  PM  
M ONDAY ‘SATURDAY

A&M
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WARRANTY DEEDS
Robert G. Willoughby and 

wife, V. Carolyn Willough­
by to Eddie Derrick and 
wife, Trudy Derrick — All 
of Lot Number (4), Scott 
Acres, a subdivision of a 
part of the (SW/4) of 
Section Number (33), Block 
••X” , W.D. & F.W. John­
son’s Subdivision, Bailey 
County, Texas.

Saul H. Griffin to Ray D. 
Terrill and wife, Joyce 
Myrtle Terrill — All of Lot 
Number (59), in Block 

•Number (5), Apple Street to 
the town of Progress, Bai­
ley County, Texas.
Tri-County Savings and 

Loan Association to Judy
K. Gordon — The (W'ly 
10'), of Lot Number (18), 
and the (E’ly 52’), of Lot 
Number (17), in Block 
Number (3), Muleshoe Park 
Addition to the town of 
Muleshoe.
Sidney D. Key and wife, 

Ruth Elnita Key to Kent B. 
Cooper and wife, Doyce 
Cooper — All of Labor 
Number (4), League Num­
ber (265), Irion County 
School Lands, in Bailey 
County, Texas.

Eddie Derrick and wife, 
Trudy Derrick, to Lyndon 
Z. Huckaby and wife, Linda
L. Huckaby — All of Lot 
Number (4). Scott Acres, a 
subdivision of a part of the 
Subdivision, in Bailey 
County, Texas.

Eddie Derrick and wife, 
Trudy Derrick, to Gary 
McCray and wife, Joy Mc­
Cray — All of Lots Num­
bers (6) and (7), Scott 
Acres, a subdivision of a 
part of the (SW/4) of 
Section Number (33), Block

Bradley Services

Held Friday
Funeral services for Sue J. 

Bradley, 66, of Lubbock 
were held at 10:30 a.m. 
Friday, in the Singleton 
Ellis Chapel of Chimes, 
with Rev. J.E. Meeks pas­
tor of the First Baptist 
Church officiating. Inter­
ment was in the Muleshoe 
Cemetary under the direc­
tion of Singleton Ellis Fun­
eral Home.

Mrs. Bradley died Wed­
nesday, June 18, at 11:30 
a.m., in the Methodist 
Hospital in Lubbock, after a 
lengthy illness.
She was born January 3, 

1914, in Amarillo and had 
been a Lubbock resident 
since 1968, moving from 
Plainview. She resided in 
Muleshoe from 1921-1966, 
where she owned and oper­
ated Sue’s Beauty Shop for 
many years. She was a 
retired beauty operator and 
a member of Eastern Star. 
Rebeccah Lodge and the 
Baptist Church.
Survivors include a son; 

Jimmy Dale Beller of Pas­
adena, Texas; a sister; 
Wanda F. Fry of Lubbock; a 
brother; Jim Cox of Mule­
shoe and one grandchild.

” X” . W.D. & F.W. John­
son's Subdivision, in Bailey 
County, Texas.

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Lehmon Calvin Jacobs and 
Judy Carol Sawyer both of 
Muleshoe
Bennie Henry Dyck and 
Irene Grace Steinbock both 
of Muleshoe
Randy Lee Wilkerson, Fri- 
ona and Sherri Sue Reese of 
Muleshoe.

'COUNTY COURT 
Tri-County Savings and 
Loan VS Alfred Allendondo 
—Judgement
John's Custom Mill VS Burl 
Cooley — Judgement 
Johnny Ray Vaughn — 
Order of Dismissal 
Donald Lees — Order of 
Dismissal

W est Plains 
Medical Center.

Report

ADMITTED
June 16, Ronald Allgood, 
Lorene Martin. Tina Galvan 
June 17, Maria Estrada, 
Neal Stewart, Gloria Del 
Toro, Ethel Sanderson, Leo 
Garcia. A.E.Moore, Willie 
Mae Caisthers 
June 18, Cindy Clayton. 
Bennie Prather 
June 19, Lewis Harp, Veta 

Self
DISMISSED

June 17, Myrtle Puckett,
Lovie Taylor, Ruby Ward,
Claude Tamez
June 18, Tena Galvan and
baby boy, Juan Montam,
Gloria Del Toro and baby
boy
June 19, Maria Estrada and 
baby girl, Ronald Allgood. 
Cindy Clayton, Neil Stewart

BARGAIN 
: OF TIIE 
i MONTH

W p>'«

BVi-Qt. FOUR 
SEASONS COOLER
Hold* 9 can* plus ice High 
density polyethylene inner 
and outer shells, friction-fit 
lid. Handle locks lid on. 

aMMtities Limited

4 0 1  K t .

M u l c b l m c

272-4511

Need it?
Lease it!

Omega 303
C O P IE R

Leasing offers you 
a logical alternative to 

the purchase of office equipment

If you need office equipment now, but your 
budget says "wait” - leasing may be the 
answer Find out how little it costs to lease 
superior office equipment from Olympia 
You'll get quality performance - and a 
method of financing your budget can live 
with. Call or stop by today.

W iHiatus liras.

There’s every reason to be 
optimistic about America’s 
long-term energy outlook, 
an oil company executive 
told The Cotton Founda­
tion’s Sixth Annual Outlook 
Conference here in Scot­
tsdale, Arizona June 10 
•11.

D.L. Bower, vice chairman 
of the board of Standard Oil 
Co. of California, said the 
U.S. has the technology to 
produce more coal, oil, gas, 
and nuclear energy.

"W e also have the po­
tential to become the world 
leader in developing syn­
thetic fuel and alternate 
energy resources,” he 
added.

For the short term. Bower 
said motor gasoline and 
diesel fuel for agriculture 
and other uses should be in 
ample supply, though at

somewhat higher prices. 
Fuel price trends will con­
tinue upward, he predicted, 
due to increasing costs of 
imported oil and the price 
control phase-out on do­
mestic production.
Bower said the challenge 

in the 80's is to free the 
nation’s competitive mar­
ket system from unneces­
sary control and restrictions 
that thwart maximum ef­
ficiency. This would allow 
the U.S. to establish the 
technical base for develop­
ing a much broader energy 
mix, he stated.
An equally optimistic out­

look for cotton was reported 
by Dr. Arlie Bowling, Na­
tional Cotton Council’s ec­
onomic and market re­
search director. He said 
cotton is entering the 80’s 
with its strongest competi­
tive position in many years. 
’’The strongest fabric 

markets are still cottons," 
he said, "and history shows 
cotton fares better than

other fibers in a reces­
sionary period such as our 
nation is entering.”

Robert E. Coleman, chair­
man of the board, Riegel 
Textile Corp,, also spoke 
about global trends in fiber 
use. "The U.S. must con­
tinue to view its (extile 
industry as part of a global 
market,” he said, "and 
aggressively pursue in­
creased export opportuni­
ties."

He urged involvement in 
international Multi-Fiber 
Agreements which would 
define textile market shares 
according to a nation's

needs and abilities to pro­
duce.

Domestically, Coleman 
predicted the textile indus­
try’s emphasis for the dec­
ade will be on capital 
spending for equipment to 
comply with increased gov­
ernment regulation and to 
provide more efficient pro­
duction.

National Cotton Council 
President Herman Propst 
cited the industry’s key 
challenges as cotton dust, 
excessive regulations, 
threatened limits on farm 
size, and development of a 
government cotton pro­

gram for the 80’s. He ex­
pressed confidence that the 
industry’s expansion this 
season marks the begin-’ 
ning of a strong growth 
period.
On another note, Dr. Jack 

Early of the National Ag­
ricultural Chemicals Assn., 
called for farmers to speak 
out on the essential role of 
pesticides in efficient food 
and fiber production. Citing 
the growing number of 
conflicting state and federal 
regulations, he said some 
states seem to be commit­
ted to outdo the federal 
government in environ­

mental and safety rule 
making.
Other conference speaker - 

reported on cotton exports, 
transportation, production 
techniques, cotton dust,
machinery, and the Foun­
dation's current research 
and educational programs.

Please
"Excuse me, officer,’’ 

said the meek-looking little )  
man to the “cop,” " but I've 
been waiting here for my 
wife for over a half an hour. 
Would you be good enough 
to order me to move on."

Kites: a toy serves as a 
tool of technology.

CAR-SENSE

. . .  the 
24 hour 

bank
Singleton-Ellis Funeral Home 
21 Hour 4 mbalance Service

.

( M l I . l S H O h  
ST A T E  H A M

PH.272-4574 Muleshoe 101 AMERICAN

E d  E d m u t o n

Though most ol us hale lo admit it. the sub-compact car 
is much more practical lor today's driving than a larga 
automobile We are forced to drive at 55 m.p.h to save 
luel. plus. In a recent survey, only 3%  ot the miles driven in 
the t'nited Slates were with more than 4 people in the car - 
and this included the children. Our engineers have 
accomplished an unbelievable obstacle In making the 
sub-compact ride, handle and drive just as well as the large 
automobile Virtually the only thing in space sacrificed is 
the luggage compartment (and not this on all sub­
compacts) and the engine compartment. Some sub- 
compscts have as much or more head-room as the large car 
and the arrangement ot the seats have given Just as much 
leg room Before you buy a new car. take a good look at 
our sub-compacts

Muleshoe Motor Co

t

ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Ninth and Avenue C 
Dana Shunko, Pastor 
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
130 W . Avenue G 
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Sunday School 10 a.m.
W orship II a .m .
LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSION 
Avenue D. and Fifth Street 
R.Q. Chavez. Pasfor 
t  ALV AKYt RA PTUiT .CHURCH 
James Williams. Pastor 
1 733 W Ave. C 
FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH
Rev. David Hamblin
507 West Second. Muleshoe
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 South First 
Elder Bernard Gowcns
MULESHOE ASSEMBLY OF 
GOD
517 South First 
Rev. Joe Stone
EMMANUEL BAPTIST CHURCH
Iglcsia Bautista Emmanuel 
107 E. Third 
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor 
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
Rev. Yncs Aleman 
East Third and Avenue E 
TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH 
3 14 Ave. B 
Rev. Gene Prevo
MULESHOE CHURCH OF CHRIST
David Cox, Minister
Clovis H ighway
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave. E 
Rev. J.E. M ceks.
PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST 
CHURCH

. Clifford Slay, Pastor

mm

Zhe Cord is m shepherd
imiiinm

PSALM S
I k i i PSALM 23
,0" herd. n

u ,\nt. want-€  d*ll »oi waiv
i i « » «
§ |  green
i id e th e  ^  .

He re*u>rt"Ui
l i b  me in t
1  for hi* m in in g

I  valley 
I v i U f r a r  no -'
& t h y r s i  L „

l ie  d o w n  in  
e th  m e  '5e_

Atx | fhe 23rd Psalm is one of the most M l
g  familiar chapters in the Bible Early 

Jotu
1 Pe1 in life, most of us have committed it Rev

i

me
I  t f

<

trf

to memory Every once in a while we
2 lit
turt should co back to these verses anddrr

1 Site think of the wonderful message of 
e he lead - i„ I r x faith and trust in God that they re iteoanno8« > M

I J ’* veal lo us They show us that we have
gh the to. a loving Father, one who will show death, ■> 1 “

U a r t  w i th  i US the right paths, one who will

t h e y  eom  *} protect an*! provide lor us These
j 4 f

scriptures end with a note of 

thanksgiving and a promise

"S’urelw ijoodness and mercy 

fhall follow me all the days of 

my life and I will dwell in the 

house of the lord forever "

Plan lo start a regular worship 

in the lord's house

’• :• -. ■•••: • vr-

$

4SSS&The (hutch a God \ oppomtetJ ogetuy in thu wotld for ip(*odmg ih* knowledge of Hu love 
for mo* ond of Nit deroond for mo« to tetpond fo thol love by tovmg hit netqhbof Vhfhou* 
thn grounding tn the love of God. no government or MXitfy 01 way of life will long 
persevere and the freedoms whwh we hold so dear will inevitably perish therefore, even 
from o selfish pomt of view one should support the Church for the soke ol fhe welfare ^4 1 
of himself ond his fomtly leyond thof. however every person should uphold ond par Y>v 
tiopote m fhe (hunh because H fells fhe truth about mon s life, deofh and destiny the 
truth which olone writ set him free lo live os o thdd of God

' o'»-m «t. A (tv Vi

1st and 3rd Sundays Living Word Teaching Center RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST
NORTHSIDE CHURCH THE COMMUNITY CHURCH 1200 Block American Blvd. CHURCH
OF CHRIST H.D. Hunter. Pastor Sunday 10 A.M. Thrusday 7:30 P.M. ,7,h and w cst Ave- D
117 F.. Birch Street Morton Highway Eric King - Pastor toy  L. Sikes, Pastor

ST. MATHEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Corner of West Boston &
W est Birch.
Rev. M.S. Brown. Pastor 
LONGVIEW BAPTIST CHURCH
Pastor B.C. Stonecipher 
Phone 946-3413
SIXTEENTH AND AVENUE D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST
Sunday - 10:30 
Evening - 6 p .m .
W ednesday - 8 -
Terry Bouchelle. Minister 
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Progress. Texas 

Rev. Cecil Osborne , Pastor

SPANISH
ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F.
Rev. Hipolito Pecina 
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN 
CHURCH 
Lariat. Texas
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor 
Sunday School Classes 
10:00 a .m .
W orship Services 
I 1:00 a.m .
MULESHOE 
BAPTIST CHURCH
8th Street and Ave. G 
Bob Dodd, Pastor 
JEHOVAH’S WITNESS 
Friona High way 
Boyd Lowery. M inister 
IM MACULATE 
CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Father Patrick Mahar 
Northeast of City in 
Morrison Edition 
UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH
George Green, Pastor 
207 E . Ave. G

Western Drug
1 I f  Main 272-5106

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B  272-t2H«

4
D a i r t i  

Queen
Margie Haw kin**. 

^ Manager

it 272-5412

Baker Farm

A If e n d Th e  C h u r c h  

O f Your
C ho i c e

Muleshoe 
Publishing Co.

Watson Alfalfa
Alfalfa llav

272-5552

James Roy Meat 
Market Co.

506 Vi. Anier. Blvd. 272- 1561

Roy

Western 
e e ’s Wear

1910 W. Anier. Blvd. 272-4665

Whites Cashway 
Grocery

Vi here Friends Meet l*riees Talk' 
102 Main

Dent-Rempe 
Implement Co.

Jtdin Deere Dealer 
Mnleslme____________272-1297

Muleshoe Co-Op 
Gins

401 S. First 

272-4511

Bailey County 
Memorial Park

“Kvery Serviee A Saered Trust" 
272-4585

Dari-Delite
Drive In

I <tke O u t  O r d e r s "
2101V First 272-4482

First National 
Bank

"Hume Owned"
22 I S. First

La m I

t

t

S t
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Deadline For Classified Ads Is 

Taesdays And Fridays

11:00

<■ CLASSIFIED RATES 
1st Insertion,

Per Word --$.15 
Minimum Charge-  

$ 2.00
2nd Insertion, 
and thereafter 

per word -- $.10 
Minimum Charge 

$1.80
CARD OF THANKS 

25 words — $3 
Over 25 words 

charged at regular 
classified rates 

Classified Display — 
$1.55 per column Inch 

Double Rate for 
Blind Ads 

DEADLINE FOR 
INSERTION 

11 a.m. Tues. for Thurs. 
11 a.m. Frl. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 

RIGHT TO CLASSIFY 
REVISE OR REJECT 

ANY AD.
NOT RESPONSIBLE 

FOR ANY ERROR 
AFTER AD HAS RUN 
ONCE.

►**•••••**••••••*•*•***
1. PERSONALS

WE BUY
USED FURNITURE AND 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 
HARVEY BASS 

APPLIANCE 
1-18s-tfc

2. LOST ft FOUND

LOST- One female Siamese 
Cat in the vicinity of Protein 
Processors. Reward offered 
Call 965-2216.

• 2-25s-4tp

3. HELP WANTED

Local person needs part 
[time job. Janitoral work 
needed. Must have
dependable vehicle. Call 
806-762-5446. Warren 
M ack.
3-19s-tfc

Experienced machine op­
erators and pressers. Apply 
in person. Fortune
Fashions (old bowling 
alley) 207 S. 9th. Farwell. 
Texas.
3-25s-2tc

Have Fun. Earn EXTRA 
money, work part time 
(own hours) Call 272-5041. 
3-25s-2tp

WANTED! a hay cuber 
operator, manager. Also 
man to work sprinklers. 
Will pay according to ex­
perience. Call 365-4552 or 
948-4472 before 8 a.m. or 
after 9:30 p .m .
3-24t-4tp

Beautician wanted at 
Patio Beauty Shop. Call 
272-4318.
3-24 t-tfc

mfOR RENT - 3 room un­
furnished duplex. Mrs. 
C.E. Layne 522 W. 8th 
272-4496 
vl-24s-tfc

8. REAL ESTATE

House For Sale By Owner, 
Richland Hills. Large 2 
bedroom brick, fenced

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 
Richland Hills Addition. 3 
bedroom. 2 car garage, 2 
bath, fireplace, central air 
and heat, storage building, 
and cedar fence. 1715 W.
Ave. H No appoint­
ments necessary.
8-24s-8tc

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 bed­
room, 2 bath, living room 
and dining room, patio. 
Call 772-5006.
8-25s-4tp

Farms Ranches Homes 
Town and Country 

Real Estate 
(8061272-4678 
John W . Sm Ith 

broker
Call 4307 or 3725 
M uleshoe, Texas 
8-5s-tfc

Choice corner lot in Rich­
land Hills. 115 front feet 
at Ave 1 & W . 19th. Call 
272-4661 after 6 p .m .

_ _ _ _ _

SMALLWOOD 
REAL ESTATE 

Joe and Ricky Smallwood 
272-4838 232 Main
901 W. Ave. B - Mobile 
home and lot. Two bed­
room, 1 */i bath. Small 
down payment.

House for sale In Richland 
Hills. ,|900 sq. ft. w j t h ^  
bedrooms. 2 baths. Excel- 
lant location.
Call 272-3631.
8-22s-tfc
For all yonr real eotate 
needs call:

GLAZE ft GOFORTH 
112 Ave.C 
272-4208

8-11-tfc

KREBBS 
REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C 
P h .272-3191 

APPRAISALS 
8-18t-tfc

MOBILE HOME FOR 
SALE: 14 x 72 Americano, 
2 bedroom, 2 bath, all built 
in appliances. Call 272-3570 
or 272-4406 and ask for 
Billy.
8-24s-4tp

HOUSE FOR SALE 3 bed- 
room, 1 3/4 bath, brick 
house, less than 2 years 
old, energy efficient with 
fenced yard. Call 272-4790 
8-24s-tfc

SUDDERTH 
REALTY INC.

Bos 627 - 109 5th St. 
Farwell, Texas 79325 
Phone (8061 481-3288 or 
481-9149

160 acres northwest of 
Muleshoe, 2 wells, lays 
good on FM highway.

320 acres irrigated with 2 
electric wells and circles 
all wheat, fenced, excel­
lent water area. Near 
Bovina Feeders.

320 acres in Lazbuddie 
area, good water area, 
circular sprinkler, 1 mile 
off highway.

160 acres irrigated, 
circle sprinkler, 2 wells, 
200 ft. water plus 3 bed­
room house, new steel 
barn. On h ighw ay north­
west of M uleshoe.

320 acres Bailey County. 2 
circle sprinklers, four 8” 
and 16" wells. 12 miles 
west of Muleshoe oi, FM 
highway 1760. Lays excel­
lent.
8-12t-tfc

FOR SALE BY OWNER
Three bedroom, I 'A baths 
living room . den. carpeted 
throughout, new roof,

We want your busineta 
“ remember’*

REID REAL ESTATE 
THURSIE REID

272-3142
George Nleman 965-2488 

or
Lncllle Harp 272-4693 
8-23a-atfc

HOMESIHuge brick 3 
bedroom, 2 bath, 6 foot
wood fence in back, in 
Richland Hills. Furniture 
goes with sale, including 
piano and microwave.

Two bedroom and bath, 
new carpet and panelling 
only SI 5,000.00

FAR MS-146 acres,  one 8 "  
well ,  one  10"  well,  cen ter  
pivot goes  with it.

Veterans, we have two 
10 acre VA tracts. 6 
percent interest. You
!*: \; ,j» . / 4 »* > 4tr4m m  rt| _■<
can t beat it.

39'/i acre, one 6"  well, 
lays good, close to town.

One quater section with 
center pivot, good water, 
good soil, 2 bedroom 
home. Only $665.00 an 
acre.

Nice 2 bedroom mobiU 
home on corner lot with 
some furniture.

7 Wanted To Rent

WANTED TO RENT Small 
furnished apartment. Call 
946-3612.

7-25s-2stc

9. AUTOMOBILES 
FOR SALE

1951 Buick, 2 door Sedan, 
runs good. Exterior and 
interior exceptionally nice 
Will sell at a good price. 
Cull 272-4588 and ask for 
Don.
9-161-tfc

FOR SALE...... 1957 Chevy
collectors item, one family 
owner, new tires, stick 
shift, clean, excellent 
condition. 272-5588 or 
272-3347 nights.
9- 23t-tfc

10. FARM EQUIP.
FOR SALE

2 Erco Side Rolls, Excel­
lent condition. 1240 ft. 
& 1280 ft. long. 72”
wheels. Self leveling noz­
zles. $3,000 ca. Call 946- 
3471 after 7:00 p.m.
10 19s-tfc

FOR SALE: Wick appli­
cators. 6-row complete less 
hydralics. $800.00. Will 
lake special orders for 8 - 
row. Call 272-3655 or mo­
bile 965-2402.
10- 25s-4tc

For Sale: Cabover Camper 
for long-bed Mid-States­
man Brand. Stove, refrig­
erator, storage, air condi­
tioner, loading jack. Phone 
272-4960 
11-19t-tfc

FOR SALE: Coleman two 
burner camping stove. Call
272-4588 for Don.
11 -25t-ctfc

PIANO IN STORAGE 
Beautiful spinet - console 
stored locally. Reported 
like new. Responsible party 
can take a big saving on low 
payment balance. Write 
Joplin Piano. Inc. Joplin 
Missouri 64801 
11 -25t-2tp

FOR SALE Office desk 
with chair, $125.00; new 
queen size matress and box 
springs with frame, $200.00 
coffee table $25.00. Call 
272-5289.
1 l-24s-4tc

PORTABLE BUILDING 
SUMMER SPECIAL
SALE
10 x 10 metal building now 
reduced to $200. Delivery 
terms available on sizes 8 
x 8 to 14 x 24.
Morgan Building 
5801 Canyon Drive 
Amarillo, Texas 

1806) 355-9498 
1 l-23t-8tc

'FOR SALE: 1- Amarillo 
gear head 70 H.P. - 4-3 
ratio -for Moline 800 motor.
1 - Green gear head - 
stocked bearings 90 H.P. - 
ratio 3-4 for 800 Moline. 1 - 
Randolph gear head 50 
H.P. - ratio 5-4 Leon Smith 
Sr. 965-2731
11-25s 2tp

ARTS AND CRAFTS 
STORE FOR SALE:Unique 
fixtures, $5,000 plus inven­
tory at cost. Can be easily 
relocated to suit buyer. Call 
[505] 359-0190. 9-5 
U-25s-3tc

BUNGER 
CONSTRUCTION 

CLOVIS. N.M.
[800] 545-2163 

1964 Mac Cabover Maxa- 
dine 235 tandem axle, 10 
speed direct. Recent over­
haul. Long wheel base, 
$4,750. 1959 KW Cabover 
10 speed, 250 engine, tan­
dem axle pusher, $4,000.
11- 25s-4tc

12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS

BURROWS 
UPHOLSTERY AND 

FURNITURE REPAIR 
118 W. Ave. C 

In the rear 
Phone 272-4255

12- 39s-tfc

13. PROPERTY FOR 
^ ^ _ L E A S E

Limited Space available for 
lease or rent in exclusive 
shopping complex on 
American Blvd. Ware­
house and storage space 
also available. Phone 272- 
5180 or 965-2471 
I3 -I3stfc

15. M IS( ELI ANEOUS

FOR SALE : HEAVY
DUTY TRAILER HITCH

Keraey Portable Welding 
Service

Any Type of Welding 
Protect your cars from hail 
and heat damage. Call 
Carl Kesey 965-2724 for 
free estimates on a carport 
15-17s-tfc

DON’T MISS THIS OP- 
PORTUNITY1! THE 
ART LOFT has recently 
purchased the entire 
stock from a retiring 
antique dealer, also 
parts of estates from 
Oklahoma and Texas: 
Furniture. Lamps, Glass, 
Primitives and Collect­
s’ s. Come see us at 
iS29 W. American Blvd.
M uleshoe.
15-23s-l2tc

FOR SALE: Maytag
matching washer and dryer 
call 272-4894 
15-25s-ltp

FOR RENT - one trailer 
space. Call 272-3718.
15-24s-tfc

McKibbens Roofing - all 
types of Roofing and 
Fenching - 17 years exper­
ience 364-6578 or 364- 
8095 Hereford 
15-16s-tfc

T ™ ™ o -----------1
! LITTLEFIELD ROOFING| 
|  Quality CrafUmanshlp |  
|Ron Foshee, Owner j
|Rt. I Box 234 (
|l.lt tie fie Id , Texas 79339 I 
Il5-21s-24tp j

The
Sandhills 

Philosopher
Editor’s note: The Sand­
hills Philospher on his 
Johnson grass farm on 
Sandy Creek takes a look at 
TV commercials this week.

Dear editor:
Since one of the quali-^

Farm Auctioneers 
Professional, Bonded, 
l icensedCall 505-393-5328 
TX-NM E021 10301 U. **

i s  14s stfc

FOR RENT
MOBILE HOME LOTS

50’xl40'
West 7th and Ave. B 

Contact Johnny St.Clair 
272-4735 

8a.m . to 6p.m .

I5-I6s-Ifr

MARTIN ROOFING 
All Work Guaranteed

Butch M artin 
923 South First Street 
Phone 806-272-5360 
Muleshoe. Texa^ 79347 
l- l ls - tfc

777777* * ••••» •* # •* * * •••
16. LIVESTOCK

a * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *

CONSIDER IT. Grazing 
could be a more profitable 
alternative for your alfalfa 
crop. It’s possible with 
Purina's Bloat Preventer. 
Contact John Mitchell 
965-2160 
16-24t-tfc

Licensed and 
Bonded

Plumbers in
Muleshoe

Clarence
Copeland

272-4485
Key Del Toro 

272-444(t
* I j e a k

272-4769

fications for speaking out 
on a subject is a basic 
ignorance of it, I feel qual­
ified to talk about a new 
Canadian law I read about 
last night and to warn 
against its spread to the 
United States.
The law bans TV commer­

cials aimed at children 13 or 
younger.

If it spreads to this country 
the television industry will 
go broke. Ninety percent of 
its commercials, as best I 
can judge, are aimed at
13-year-olds or younger.

For instance, for over a 
year now an ex-movie star 
has been straightening out 
nervous people who drink 
too much coffee of the 
wrong brand. When they 
switch to his, they settle 
down to shooting better 
golf, practicing better law, 
etc. I had no idea there 
were that many golfers and 
lawyers with 13-year-old 
minds.
Now that brand of coffee is 

not to be confused with the 
brand that’s grown on a 
mountain and picked one 

tbean at a time, hauled -

down by a donkey and 
shipped to every grocery 
store in the United States. 
I’ve never unders4ood how 

that donkey could make 
that many trips. Maybe . 
13-year-old could explain it 
to me.

Now I won’t go into the 
mental age of soap com­
mercials, detergents, floor 
waxes, baby diapers or cars 
some ex-football player told 
you to buy.

1 feel sure no Congress­
man will read this letter 
when it appears in The 
Journal and it's a good 
thing, because if one did 
and thereafter got a bill 
passed banning TV com­
mercials aimed at 13-year- 
old minds or younger, 
sooner or later the bill 
would be expanded to in­
clude banning TV programs 
of the same mental caliber, 
and then what would we 
have left?
What’s on for tonight? 

Somebody has misplace my 
TV Guide.

Yours faithfully.
J. A,

Rent-to-Own 
Color TV

Washers Dryers Refrigerators

No Service Expense No Interest To Pay

117 MAIN

IDifoon
Appliance

MULESHOE
272-5631

- jjfi.

THE CLOVIS Y.M.CA IS DEVELOPING TWO HANDBALL- 
RACKETBALL COURTS AND ADVANCE MEMBERSHIPS

ARE NOW BEING TAKEN!!!
*400 MEMBERSHIP
THIS IS FOR FAMILIES WHICH ENTITLES THEM TO A YEARS MEMBERSHIP 
AT THE YMCA PLUS USE Of THE HEALTH CLUB AND HANDBALL COURTS 
FOR A YEAR....

8300 MEMBERSHIP
THIS IS AN INDIVIDUAL MEMBERSHIP AND ENTITLES THE INDIVIDUAL TO 

THE SAME PRIVILEDGES AS THE FAMILY MEMBERSHIP...

CALL 762-3198 FOR FURTHER INFORMATION



Eleven Day Trip
✓

To Washington
July 9 is the last day to 

register and pay tuition for 
an 11-day trip to Washing­
ton, D.C. this summer 
sponsored by South Plains 
College in Levelland.

The trip scheduled for 
July 23 • August 2 will 
fulfill six hours of college 
credit in American govern­
ment, along with three 
additional weeks classtime. 
Tuition is $39 for in­

district students, S45 for 
out-of-district and $134 for 
out-of-state students, ac­
cording to Jerry Barton, 
SPC dean of admissions 
and registrar.

Balance of the payment

Jaycees 
In Action
By Chuck Smith

The Muleshoe Jaycees are 
starting off the new year 
with several new projects. 
At the Monday meeting, 
several of the projects were 
discussed.

1. The Jaycees will be 
promoting highway safety 
and energy conservation, 
by urging all motorists to 
drive 55 mph. This is being 
done in conjuction with the 
Texas Jaycees and the 
Texas Highway Depart­
ment. More details will be 
given later.
2. The Jaycees ran a toll 

booth at one of the city 
intersections on Saturday, 
June 21. Proceeds from the 
toll booth were to be dona­
ted to Muscular Dystrophy 
for ‘Jerry’s Kids’, Martin 
Nowlin was in charge of the 
project.
3. Vice President, Ricky 

Mata, discussed some of 
the Fourth of July activities 
that the Jaycees will spon­
sor. There will be a Mar­
athon Race, chaired by 
Troy Stigmiller, and some 
other activities still being 
planned.
4. Other topics discussed 

by the Jaycees included; an 
August 23 retreat to Dallas 
to see the Cowboys and 
Oilers play; a family social 
at the Muleshoe Country 
Club on June 21 and the 
Texas Jaycee Summer 
Board meeting and Five 
Outstanding Young Texan 
presentation scheduled at 
Lubbock July 25, 26 and 27.
Allen Davis, voted Out­

standing Young Farmer for 
1979-80, received his 
plaque at the meeting. 
Jimmy Rogers received his 
Leadership Dynamics Cer­
tificate (and also volun­
teered to be flag chairman). 
Tommy Gunstream re­
ceived the Spring Board 
award. Don Hovland re­
ported on the disco held 
June 14 and was recognized 
for a job well done. 

Attending last Monday's 
meeting were Galen Bock, 
Ricky Mata, Kent Kelly, 
Walter Little, Johnny St. 
Clair, Troy Stigmiller 
(newest member). Chuck 
Smith, Ernest Morvec, 
Jimmy Robers, Dan Hov­
land and Tommy Gun- 
stream. Guests were Wal­
ter White, Allen Davis and 
Alex Williams.

must be made by July 16.
Total cost, including tui­

tion, round trip airfare and 
housing, is $724 for in­
district students, $730 for 
out-of-district students, 
and $819 for out-of-state 
students.
Food and personal ex­

penses will be extra.
Two weeks of class be­

forehand and a one-week 
class following the trip, 
planned by SPC social sci­
ence chairman Travis 
Spears, also are required.

For more information, 
contact South Plains Col­
lege at (306)894-9611, ext. 
220.

Three Way 
News

By Mrs. H.W. Garvin

Mrs. H.W. Garvin was in 
Clovis Tuesday and Wed­
nesday staying with her 
grandchildren.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Larry Tar- 

vathan and boys from Can­
yon spent part of last week 
with the S.G. Longs.

•••*•
Mr. and Mrs. Troy Tyson 

and children from Level- 
land visited the George 
Tysons Sunday.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 

Box and children from Clo­
vis spent Thursday until 
Monday with her mother, 
Mrs. H.W. Garvin. Rev. 
and Mrs. James Gillentine 
from Lubbock spent Friday 
night with her mother, 
Mrs. H.W. Garvin.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Kin­

dle and the Joey Kindles all 
from Maple and the Jerry 
Damrons from Needmorc 
were dinner guests in the 
Bobby Kindle home Sun­
day.

***** $
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 

Long from Amarillo visited 
the S.G. Longs Friday and 
Saturday.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Sowder 

were in Clovis Saturday 
playing softball in a tourn­
ament. They spent Satur­
day night and Sunday with 
her father, A.G. Taylor in 
Muleshoe.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. George 
Tyson were supper guests 
in the D.A. Williams home 
in Enochs Monday night. 

*****
Farmers in the community 

are busy planting their crop 
over and trying to save 
what little crop was left 
after the sandstorms.

*****
Mr. and Mrs. W.M. Eu­

banks and Mr. and Mrs. 
George Tyson attended the 
Senior Citizens meeting in 
Portales Saturday evening. 

*****

©  Lonely Heart

The
Consumer
Alert

by Mark White 
Attorney General

AUSTIN-NOTICK OF 
UNCLAIMED ACCOUNTS: 
If you happened to be reading; 
the legal notice section of vour 
newspaper during the month 
of May. you might have 
noticed local financial 
institutions publishing 
columns of names and 
addresses of individuals with 
unclaimed or dormant 
accounts. The notice also 
indicated that unclaimed 
amounts will be paid upon 
proof of ownership at theoffice 
of the financial institution 
within nine<9) months or they 
will be turned over to the State1 
Treasurer.

During the last five years, 
almost $18 million dollars of 
unclaimed accounts have been 
deposited with the State 
Treasurer. From that total. 
justover$l million dollars has 
ever been claimed. How do 
these funds come to the State 
Treasury and what rights do 
the original owners have if 
they want to get their money 
back?

The Texas Bank Escheat 
Law identifies dormant 
accounts as those which have 
been inactive for more than 
one (1) year. An account is 
considered to be inactive when 
there has been no money 
deposited or withdrawn 
within the past year, 
excluding interest or service 
charges that are added or 
subtracted by the institution 
itself. A dormant account wdJ 
lose its status at any time that 
a deposit or withdrawal is 
made into or from the account

It is a common miscon­
ception that after an extended 
period of dormancy, an 
institution may "absorb'' the 
funds held in a dormant 
account. Many individuals 
believe that this is how the 
institution will get “paid" for 
keeping the account on their 
books during the period of 
dormancy. However, this is 
not the case. Once an account 
is determined to he dormant, it 
is against the law for an 
institution to transfer, 
convert, or reduce the account 
through sendee charges or 
assessments. The law requires 
that the institution maintain 
the account for a period of 
seven years. Once this period 
has elapsed.the institution is 
required to publish notices 
to persons with unclaimed 
accounts in a newspaper 
within the city or county 
where the account is being 
held These notices appeared 
recently in local newspapers 
throughout the state, because 
the statute requires pub­
lication during the month of 
May If no one has claimed the 
funds within nine months 
after the notice, the institution 
is then required to turn the 
money over to the State 
Treasurer. The institution is 
only allowed to charge an 
account a proportionate 
amount of the cost of the 
published no*ice.

Another misconception is 
that once the State Treasurer 
receives the money, each 
previous owner loses their 
claim. This also is not the case. 
The State Treasurer is 
required to maintain a special 
fund for payments to those 
who may at any time in the 
future establish their

agri-facts
By

Bill Wooley
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We Will Be
Closed

I Ju n e  30- J u l y  7

We Are Closing For 
Repairs & For A
Short Vacation

Have farmers done anything 
for you lately? Probably not 
At least, not since your last 
meal. Figures developed by 
researchers with the USDA 
indicate that American 
farmers' production last year 
was high enough that each 
man farming produced 
enough to feed 57 people. In 
the European Common 
Market countries one farmer 
produced enough to feed 23 
other people, tnc average of 
all developed countries was 
less than half the productivity 
in the U.S. and in Russia the 
average farmer produced 
enough to feed only about 8 
others. Not only is the 
American product iv i t y  
important in keeping us all 
well fed tmost too welil it's 
also significant in that it 
allows 96 out of every 100 
people to work in area*, out 
side food production. 1 hat 
makes possible the production 
of the wide variety of goods 
and services which constitute 
our unparalleled living 
standard. Keep it up farmers!

ownership of funds that have 
been received from dormant 
accounts. The special fund, 
called the State Conservator 
Fund, is required to maintain 
at least a $250,(XX) balance 
Because considerably more

money is received each year 
into the fund than the balance 
requires, the additional funds 
left unclaimed by owners are 
transferred to the Available 
School Fund

Even though the funds have 
been relinquished to the State 
Treasurer, an individual with 
a valid claim to funds left in a 
dormant account may still go 
to the institution where the 
funds were deposited in order 
to make their claim. If the 
amount claimed is $100.00 or 
less, the bank may pay the 
claim and get reimbursed 
from the State Treasurer. 
However, if the amount 
claimed is greater than 
$100.00. the payment must 
first be approved by the State 
Treasurer and the Attorney 
General.

If you have a question 
concerning the status of an 
a;count, contact the institu­
tion where the account is being 
maintained. Banks, savings 
associations and other 
financial institutions are 
generally very glad to close out 
or consolidate small inactive 
accounts.  Many t imes 
accounts that have been 
forgotten or are no longer 
useful to the individuals must 
be maintained for years by the 
institutions at a considerable 
cost.

Responsibility
"Who's the responsible 

man here?’’ asked the caller.
"If you mean the fellow 

who always gets the blame,” 
answered the office boy, 
"vou arc speaking to him 
now."

All Mens Dress 
Long Sleeve 

Shirts

$5.00

i, ;( —• *5 Mens Dress
L ' t - ^  ̂  ft Short* Sleeve 

Shirts

V  *3.00 .H

Special Group

Mens L/S
Western Shirts

r A t

*10.95,

for *30

Boys Dress 

I Western Shirts

1*3.00off

*1

Mens or Boys 

Summer Knit 

Shirts buy one 

at regular price 

get second for

*1.00
Down Jackets 

Reg. *75.00 now

*39.95
by Walls, i

»

June 23-28
Sign up all week for drawings on Sat. 28. 

No purchases necessary • 18 years old or older.

Tiny Lynn Western Band to play 
from 1-4 p.m. in parking lot on Sat. 6/28.

Wrangler Denim Jeans:
STYLE REG. SALE PRICE

945 *15.95 $12.50

935 *15.95 $12.50

938 *14.75 *10.50

13MWZ *16.95 $ 13.00

Stretch *15.95 *12.50

All items not on sole or marked down 

1 0 %  off.

Ladies Fashion Jeans by

Lady Wrangler Lady Lee 

Levi for Gals 

Faded Glory

Rumble Seats 

City Girl

Free Balloons for kids. Sat. 28, 

Ralph the Wrangler down 

w l be present.

All Ladies 
Blouses 

and Shirts

40% off.

All Ladies Jeans 

2 0 % o f f .

Large group 

’Ladies

Fashion /£ \ 
Joans V s

*12.95
-•values to 

*26.95

V

P -

All Mens Western Suits

*99.95 values to *149.95 

c

Wrangler Boys and Student 
Jeans:

Boys Flare Reg. *11.50... *9.95 

Student Flare Reg. *13.95.. .*11.50 

Boys Big Bell Reg. *11.95... *10.25

Student Big Bell
Reg. *14.50... 11.95

Large group sale Boots-all other 

Boots are marked down for this 

sale, save up to $  j a

per pair.

e e s  WESTERN WEAR

All Hats 30%  

off-open 

crowns creased

& blocked while 
you wait.

Western Belts 
names put on 

free.,

All Hat

accessories, 

Jewelry, Belt

Buckles, Hat 
Bands

20%
off.)

Sole representatives from 

various companies to 

be present on Sat. 6/28.


