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Mr. and Mrs. Max Schneemann 
on their Golden Wedding Anniversary

Mr., and Mrs. Max Schneemann 
Celebrate Golden Anniversary At 
Reception Here Sunday Afternoon

More than 600 friends 
ficm all parts of West Tex­
as called to extend good 
wishes to Mr. and Mrs. Max 
Schneemann of Ozona Sun­
day afternoon from four to 
six when their children 
honored them on their 50th 
wedding anniversary with 
a reception at the new O- 
ziona auditorium-coliseum.

Their fiftieth anniversary 
aotually w as yesterday, 
Wednesday, June 9, hut the 
reception wa.s stepped up to 
Sunday afternoon to make 
it more convenient f o r  
friend's to attend.

Hosts for the beautifully 
appointed reception were 
children of the couple and 
their families. They includ­
ed Mr. and Mrs. Miller Ro­
bison of Marfa; Mr. and 
Mrs. Max Schneemann, Jr.; 
and Mr, and Mrs. Bill

Schneemann, all of Big- 
Lake; Mr. and Mrs. Phil­
ip Schneemann of Grants, 
N. M.; Mr. and Mrs. W. E. 
Reynolds, Jr., of Pampa. 
A n o t h e r  daughter, Mrs. 
Clyde Sikes, Jr., is deceased.

The big auditorium re­
ception hall was beautifully 
decorated with a profusion 
of flowers, most of them 
gifts ifrcm well - wishing 
friends.

The gold theme was car­
ried out in roses and chry- 
sanithemiim arrangements 
throughout the hall. Vine 
entwined pillars around the 
hall held bouquets of yellow 
rosebuds. A golden punch 
fountain, b u l b i n g  over 
where guests filled their 
punch cups from the over­
flowing liquid further em­
phasized the gold theme. 
(Continued on Last Page)

Two Ozonans 
Injured In Lawn 
MowerAccidents

Rex Halydier, Crockett 
County Commissioner, was 
in the local hospital Wed­
nesday after getting his 
hand caught in the blade 
of a lawn m o w e r  at his 
home.

Halydier lost part of one 
finger and it was feared 
that part of another finger 
would have to be removed.

The accident was the sec­
ond of this type in the past 
few days. Tuesday D a v i d  
North, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Pete North, received a se­
vere cut on one of his toes 
when it came in contact 
with the mower at his 
home. Young North was a- 
fole to return to his home 
following first aid treat­
ment at the hospital. 

------------oOo------------
W om an ’s Club T o 
Stage Party Night 
Benefit Piano Fund

Ozona Woman’s Club will 
stage its “party night” 
game contests in the coli­
seum auditorium Saturday 
night, June 26.

Proceeds from the even­
ing’s entertainment will go 
into the club’s treasury to- | 
ward payment for the new | 
piano given by the club for 
use in the civic center audi­
torium.

Games will include bridge 
forty-two and dominoes. 
Mrs. Ivy Mayfield, chair­
man of the club’s projects 
committee, is chairman of 
arrangements for the party. 
Fees and prizes to be offer­
ed will be announced later. 
Play will start at 8 p, m. 

------------oOo-----------
WE BUY Used Furniture 

Stoves and Refrigerators. 
'Brown Furniture Co. Ic

CROCKETT COUNTY 
HOSPITAL NEWS

Patients admitted to hos­
pital since June 1st;

Douglas J. Blanton, me­
dical; Steve Poindexter, San 
Angelo, surgical; Mrs. San­
tos Aguilera, obstetrical; 
Clint Strother, accident; O. 
R. Blanton, accident; Jo­
seph Horton, accident; Al­
bert Borrego, Jr., medical: 
Mrs. Walter Dunlap, medi­
cal; A. C. Hoover, medical; 
R e x  Halydier, accident; 
Mrs. Manuel Villarea, Jr., 
Obstetrical.

Patients dismissed: Mrs. 
Felisita Ramirez, Frank Or­
tiz, Mrs. Jeff Reynolds and 
infant daughter, Mrs. Joe 
H. Sellers, Mrs. Pedro Go­
mez, E. A. Bishop, Ned Hen­
ry, Mrs. Bilf Friend, J. G. 
Hufstedler, J. L. Hill, Mrs. 
Dora Bosworth, Mrs. James 
Perry and infant daughter 
and Mrs. A1 Mills.

Three Men Hurt 
In Flash Fire At 
Miller Gas Well

Three Ozona men were 
seriously burned and are in 

I the Crockett County Hospi­
tal as the result of a flash 
fire at a gas well on the 

• Mrs. Roy Miller ranch a- 
bc'ut 1'5 miles south of O- 
zona Monday.

The three men injured 
were O. R. (Tex.) Blanton, 
owner of the Blue Construc­
tion Co., Clint Strother of 
Blue Construction Co. and 
Joe Horton with the North­
ern Natural Gas Co.

A separator at the well, 
which is an active producer 
was being repaired at the 
ijiimc and, though the bur­
ner had been extinguished, 
it still .giave off enough heat 
CT contained some glowing 
carbon that ignited the es- 
c'cpiiug gas.

The fire was quickly ex­
tinguished. One fire truck 
from Ozona answered the 
call for help during the fire.

According to reports from 
the local hospital, Strother 
and Blanton were the most 
extensivey burned of the 
trio but all three were re­
ported to be doing well at 
midweek.

------------oOo------------
Rev. Garrett T o  
Serve New Y ear As 
M ethodist Pastor

Rev. Leonard Garrett was 
returned as pastor of the 
Ozona Methodist Church 
for another year by action 
cf the Southwest Texas 
Conference of the church, 
concluded last Sunday in 
San Antonio with the read­
ing of appointments by Bis­
hop Eugene Slater.

Rev. Garreitt will begin 
his third year as pastor of 
the local church with .ser­
vices next 'Sunday. He came 
to the Ozona church from 
Crystal City.

Seaman Ronnie Beall

-oOo-

-oOo-

Despite Cool, 
Swimmers Take 
To Pool Waters

Cool, cloudy and windy 
weather greeted swimmers 
the first week in June as 
Ozona swimming pools op­
ened for the summer sea­
son.

Despite the lack of sum­
mer-like weather, many of 
Ozona’s younger swimmers 
took to the water at all 
three of the local pools.

H. O. Hoover and Chick 
Womack will once again be 
in charge of the south pool 
with Fred Hickman and 
Hack Leath at the North 
Pool and Alonzo Fielders at 
the East Pool.

In opening for the thir­
teenth full season of opera­
tion, 'the county pools will 
be open for three months 
and will close when school ' 
opens the last week in Aug- 1

Senate Increase 
Amendment Up 
For Vote Sept. 7

In this issue of the Stock- 
man is the complete text 
of the proposed amendment 
to the state constitution, 
prcvlding for an increase in 
the size of the state Senate

The amendment, which is 
to be voted on September 
7, arises from the redistrict­
ing efforts of the just past 

I session cf the Legislature.
Last year’s decision by 

the Supreme Court that ail 
representation in the State 
giovernments had to be on a 
purely population distribu­
tion foi'mul'a, or the one- 
for-one vote decision as it 
has b e e n  called, brought 
about the effort to re-divide 
the state for legislative pur­
poses.

This interpertation of the 
Federal Consititution result­
ed in it being rejected in 
the beginning and it was 
not until it was amended to 
give the small states equal 
votes in the U. S. Senate 
that it could be adopted.

However, voters are not 
(Continued on Last Page)

Dallas Organist 
T o  Give Concert A t 
M ethodist Church

Weldon Flanagan, well 
known organist from Dallas 
will give an organ concert 
at the Ozona Methodist 
Church Tuesday, June 15, 
at 7:30 p. m. Mr. Flanagan 
will be performing on the 
newly installed Allen Organ 
in the church.

The public is cordially in­
vited to hear Mr. Flanagan 
on. the new organ.

Beall Com pletes 
Basic Training 
For Coast Guard

Alameda, Calif. — Sea­
man Apprentice Ronald E. 
Beall, USCG, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Pink Beall of Ozona, 
was graduated from basic 
training May 21, at the 
Coast Guard Recruit Train­
ing Center, Alameda, Calvf.

The 12-week basic train­
ing prepares him for duty 
in the Coast G u a r d  and 
helps him adjust to military 
life.

Recruits are taught mili­
tary drill, small boat hand­
ling, use of small arms, fire­
fighting, seamanship, first 
aid and Coast Guard his­
tory. Instruction included 
study of atomic and biolo­
gical warfare and an intro- 
doiction to maritime law en­
forcement.

----------- "OOO-;---------- -

Crockett ^rrass 
Judging Team Is 
Second In State

The Crockett County 4-H 
Grass Judging Team placed 
second in the state 4 -H  
grass judging contest held 
at Texas A&M University 
last week. Hugh Coates won 
second hiĝ h individual a- 
ward in grass judging. O- 
ther team members were 
Rex Bland, Steve Talaiferro 
and Janie Edgerton.

The team was accompan­
ied to A&M by county a- 
gent Pete W. Jacoby, Larry 
Williams, coach of the team 
and 4-H adult leaders Carl 
Conklin and Mrs. Charles 
Edgerton.

Sutton County 4-H team 
won first place in the State 
Conte.st.

----------- oOo----------- -
Baptist V acation  
School T o End In 
Exercises Friday

The vacation Bible School 
of the First Baptist Church 
will hold its commence­
ment services at the Church 
Friday night following a 
week’s activity.

Enrollment at the five- 
day vacation school reached 
168 Wednesday morning, 
marking a slight increase 
over last year’s school.

Mission study, Bible stor­
ies, and handwork, compose 
miost of the activity of the 
various groups, which range 
in age from 4 to 17.

This year as a b a s i c  
change in the method of 
operation in the school, the 
young peoples’ section of 
the school has been held 
at night instead of in the 
morning, and the new or­
der of Ofperation has met 
with considerable success 
with 32 young people on 
hand Tuesday night.

:-----------oOo----------- -
Miss Judy Ingham daugh­

ter of Mr. and Mrs. B. B. 
Ingham, Jr., left this week 
for Whichita Falls where 
she will join her uncle and 
aunt, Dr. and Mrs. Garland 
Dean of Wichata Falls, on 
a vacation trip to Mexico. 
The party will visit Monter­
rey and other points of in­
terest in Mexico.

For Mrs. Claudie Butler -

35-Year Career With Telephone 
Co. Ends With Closing Of Office

Eighth Annual 
Ozona Jr. Rodeo 
Set July 8,9,10

The eighth annual Ozona 
Junior Rodeo, sponsored by 
the Ozona Lions Club, and 
an AJRA approved contest, 
will be held at the Oirana 
Fair Grounds July 8, 9, and 
10.

The rodeo will run for 
three nights and will have 
three age divisions, each of 
which wil have competition 
for both boys and girls.

A parade and the crown­
ing of the Rodeo Queen will 
highlight the first day of 
activity. The show is ex­
pected to draw a bumper 
crop of contestants as us­
ual, with trophy buckles to 
average winners in all ev­
ents and, a best all-arcuntl 
tro.phy to be presented.

Each of the night perfor­
mances will begin at 7:45 
and a dance on the con­
crete slab juist west of the 
arena will once again be 
staged each night of the 
rodeo.

Barrel racing, pole bend­
ing, breakaway roping, steer 
riding, bull riding, and calf 
tie-down will be included in 
the events set for the ro­
deo, with groups 12 years 
and undei', 13 through 15, 
and 16 through 19.

Lions Club committees 
changed; with selling' adver­
tising for the program and 
advertising the rodeo in the 
surrounding area have al­
ready begun work.

Prospective entries can 
secure entry blanks by writ­
ing Box 596 or stopping by 
the Ozona Boot and Sad­
dlery.

------------oOo——— —
Stanley W illiam s 
Takes M aster From  
University o f  Tex.

The University of Texas 
awarded 228 master’s de­
grees at the close of th e  
spring semester. Dean Gor­
don Whaley of the graduate 
school announced.

An era will end with re­
tirement of Mrs. Cliaudie 
Butler and the closing of 
the G e n e r a l  Telephone 
Company business office at 
5 p. m. on June 30, it was 
officially announced this 
week by R. R. McOullough, 
district manager.

McCullough said t 'h a t 
Mrs. Butler will continue to

G arza Hurls New 
O zona Club T o  4-3 
V ictory  Over Eden

Tony Garza fanned 12 
batters and gave but three 
hits after the first two in- 
ings last Sunday afternoon 
a)t Powell Field when the O- 
zona Tigers a newly organ­
ized baseball team, defeat­
ed the Eden Bulldogs 4 to 
3.

Garza got off to a rough 
start, getting shelled for six 
'hits and all three cf the vi­
sitors runs in the first two 
frames, but after that, Ed­
en batters wore themselves 
out carrying their bats back 
to the dougout.

Ozona scored one in the 
third, two in th e  fourth 
and one in the ninth to 
take the contest, as they 
collected a total of 12 hits.

Garza fanned the side in 
the fifth and got two on 
strikes in the sixth, sev­
enth, and ninth innings. 

------------oOo------------

Open House At 
Shell Gasoline 
Plant June 19th

Invitations have b e e n  
miailed f r o m  the Midland 
office of the Shell Oil Co. 
to Ozonans and others in 
the area to the company o- 
pen house at its O z o n a  
Gasoline P l a n t  recently 
completed and placed in 
opertaion on the Dick Hen­
derson ranch two miles 
northwest of Ozona.

Here last week making 
final arrangements for the 
open house were John Reid 
of the Shell Oil Co., public 
relations department i n 
Midland, and Sam Paine,Included in this number 

was Stanley Ben Williams, | area gas manager for Shell, 
son olf Mr. and Mrs. Ben ! The open house is to be 
Williams formerly of Ozona. staged from 12 o’clock noon

Stanley, who is now em­
ployed as a teacher in Cor- 
sioaha High School, is a 
graduate of Ozona H i g h  
school, and took his B. A. 
from Baylor University.

He is the grandson of 
Mrs. S. L. Butler of Ozona.

to 4 p. m. on Saturday, June 
19. A barbecue dinner will 
be served by the Odessa 
Chuck Wagon Gang.

Further details of the 
plant opening and the open 
house event will be availa­
ble next week.

Mrs. Joe Bean, president cf the Ozena Woman’s League, 
is shown here as she presented, the League’s Science 
Scholarship award to David Jacoby, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Peite Jacoby. Jacoby, who was a Junior in Ozona High 
school this past year, will attend a National Science 
Foundation summer course at Texas A&M  this summer.

work through that week in 
order for all of the Ozona 
and Barnhart telephone ac- 
counts to be transferred to 
the San Angelo business of­
fice. She will then have a 
one-month vacation before 
her 35 year telephone car­
eer 'Comes to a close. Mrs. 
Butler, who had held the 
job of cashier since 1958, 
has been with the tele­
phone company in Ozona 
since her telephone career 
began.

S p e c i a l  recognition of 
Mrs. Butler’iS- long service 
is planned before the office 
closes, McCullough said.

The closing of this busi­
ness offices is in line with a 
company - wide program 
which has been underway 
for several years, according 
to 'McCullough. The pro­
gram is designed to central­
ize business office opera­
tions, improve operating ef­
ficiency and cut operating 
costs.

During past months, the 
move was discussed infor- 
maly wtih various civic 
leaders, according to Mc- 
Oullouglh. “While they too 
are sorry to see the office 
close !they were understand- 
inig of the Company’s ef­
forts to keep eperating costs 
at a minimum and keep 
pace with the everchanglng 
requirements of our busi­
ness,” McCullough com­
mented. !

After the business office 
closeis, Ozona customers 
miay mail their bills in the 
self - addressed envelopes 
eheiosed with their month­
ly statements or they may 
pay them in person in the 
San Angelo business office 
at 14 W. Twohig, McCul­
lough said.

“For these Ozena custom­
ers who prefer to pay in 
person, we are attempting 
to make contractual ar­
rangements with a local bu­
siness to accept telephone 
payments” McCullough ex­
plained.

The accounts of all Barn­
hart telephone customers 
who now pay their tele­
phone bills to the Ozona 
office, also will be trans­
ferred to San Angelo.

To discuss telephone bu­
siness after the Ozona of­
fice is closed, Ozona cus­
tomers may continue to 
dial the same local Ozona 
telephone number, 392-2606 
to reach the service repres­
entative who will handle 
'their acccunt in San An­
gelo. Barnhart customers 
may continue to call the 
San Angelo business office 
—• without charge — by 
dialing Operator and ask­
ing for Enterprise 2484. 

------------ oO o--------------
Heating, Cooling, 
System Planned In 
M edical Building

T h e  Crockett County 
Commissioners Court is ask­
ing for bids for installation 
of 9, new heating and cool­
ing system for the county 
medical building, w h e r e  
doctors rent offices, south 
of the Crockett County Hos­
pital.

Heretofore, the building 
has been heated and cooled 
by the same system which 
serves the hospital a hot 
water circulating system in 
the winter and chilled wa­
ter in the summer.

The system is inadequate 
for both buildings in ex­
treme weather and) the 
court was of the opinion 
that a separate system for 
the medical building would 
improve the operations in 
both buildings.
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Claudie could.
All that is to be changed 

come June 30. The local 
business office of General 
Telephone is to be closed. 
There’ll be no place to pay 
your itelephone bill in per­
son arrd if you mail your 
check you’ll have to use a 
5 cent instead of a 4 cent 
■stamp.

But the big less will be 
that pleasant voice, that 
helpful, acoom-odating one 
who stood between us and 
the cold machinery and the 
cold corporation. It’s been

Any erroneous reflection upon the character of any ! such a short jump from the 
person or firm appearing in these columns will be gladly I crank phone and “two longs 
and promptly corrected if called to the attention of the  ̂ short ring” to reach
management.

CLASSIFIED RATES — 5 cents per word first insertion; 
4 cents per word each additional insertion. Minimum 
charge 50 cents per insertion.
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a neighbor; an even short­
er one from the common 
battery .system. The d i a l  
system is handier, fa,Ster 
and more efficient. But 
sometimes there’s a nostal-

ON MIXING RACES
It is net enough that the 

Negro must be transplanted 
among whites even over his 
own objection, his children 
mixed with white children 
even ii they have to be 
Itransplanted far distances 
from itheir own hemes and 
districts.

It is not enough that the 
Negro riCters and pillaging 
mobsters that roamed the 
streets and smashed store 
windows, carried off mer­
chandise and did millions 
cf dollars in damage to a 
section of New York must 
remain outside the pale of 
law enforcement It is not 
enough that marchers, sit-

WHY LET DOWN OlJR 
GUARD?

The Adminisibration’s im­
migration on bill (S.500 and 
H.R.2580) to replace the 
McCarran Walter Act and 
abolish the orderly selec­
tion of readily assimilable 
immigarnts under ithe na­
tional origins quota system 
is the dreamboat by which 
the Commies and fellow- 
travellers in our midst look 
to a mass infiltration of 
potential enemy a g e n t s ,  
spies and revoluitionaries.

The bill is now before the 
Senate Judiciary Commit­
tee where it might best be 
interred — lest, if it were 
reported out. White House 
pressure could well prevail.

END OF AN ERA
Cold machinery bias al­

ready replaced the tinkle- 
bell voice of the old time 
“hello girl” of the days of 
the manually operated tele­
phone, and replaced her 
with the coldly matter-of- 
fadt mechanical v o i c e 
which, even before you 
build up hope, announefes 
that “This is a record­
ing—”

Now the equally cold ways 
of the corporation have 
brought about 'the end of 
an era in Ozona — the en­
forced retirement of Mrs. 
Claudie Butler, for m o r e  
than 35 years the pleasant, 
always helpful representa­
tive of the telephone sys­
tem, and for more years 
than we care to count, was 
the acutal “voice” of the 
telephone, the oracle of in­
formation, the willing help­
er in time of need. She was 
the one person in town who 
knew where everybody else 
could be reached, knew ev­
erybody’s v o i c e  without 
need to ask, knew every­

body’s telephone number 
and, in case one was not a- 
vailable at his own phone, 
knew what neighbor to call 
to reach him.

It was almost a time for 
m'ourning in the town when 
the dial r e p l a c e d  the 
switchboard. Who were we 
igoing to call to hunt down 
Joe Bloke for us? That re­
corded voice was no help— 
you got the same answer 
every time. It wasn’t easy, 
but we finally adjusted to 
it — and if anything went 
wrong there was always 
that company number you 
could call and get Claudie 
on the phone to tell your

inners, stand-inners, lie-
inners can invade the rights ' To assist in such interment, 
of others with confidence ! Liberty Lobby is urging 
that no law can touch them constituents of Senators 
that ii they are molested by  ̂Dirksen, Ervin McClellan, 

gic longing for the days of ! law enforcement officers a , Eastland, Smathers, Long,  
“number please” and the hue and cry will go up all-i Ellender, Byrd and Robert- j

across the front pages of ; son of Virginia and M ajori-i 
the pink press that their Leader Mansfield — all | 
“ civil rights” are being in- | of whom are believed to be i 
vaded. It is not enough that ' opposed or leading that way I 
they can with impunity stop j — to write strong letters 
traffic and commerce with | of protest against the new 
their marches and demon- | measure.
.ctrati'cns — all without re- i -v̂ hile it is encouraging 
gard to the civil or human | note that a recent opi- 
rights of others. | nion, poll indicates nation-

It is not enough, we say; | wide supporit of the McCar- 
that others must suffer | j-on Walter Act by m o r e  
these indignities that the i than two to one, few citi- 
Negro might not be “psy- | zens realize that its “Asia-

S'cft, human voice of “cent­
ral” who .̂ t̂ood r e a d y  to 
summon the doctor, hunt 
down a strayed child, or 
mate, connect you with the 
law without a number, or 
even call you at any desig­
nated hour of the morning 
when your alarm clock went 
on the blink.

But time has a way of 
moving on. Scenes change, 
faces c h a n g e ,  memories 
fade. But Ozonans of a 
quarter century past will 
scarce forget the soft spok­
en, always unhurried and 
always patient “Number 
Please?” of Claudie But­
ler.

------------oOo------------
Mrs. Pleas L. Childress, 

Miss Lucille Childerss, Mrs. 
Lowell Littleton, Mrs. Roy 

troubles to. There’d be no i Henderson, Miss June Bun-

Gasser Com pleted 
On R oy  Hendersons

Union Texas Petroleum 
Corp. No. 1-25 Roy Hender- 
ison, % mile southeast of 
!the nearest production in 
the Ozona ( Canyon sand) 
gas field of Crockett Coun­
ty was finaled for a cal- 
culalted, absolute open flew 
of 2.5 million cubic feet of 
gas per day, with gas-liquid 
ratio unreported.

Production was through 
perforations between 6,491- 
6,599 feet.

On the latest 20 - hour 
production gauge it made 
69 barrels of distillate and 
eight barrels of load water. 
No choke was reported.

It was scheduled in the 
Ozona, Southwest multipay 
field, however. Canyon sand 
gas production in the O.zo- 
na. East; Ozona, Southeast 
and Ozona, Southwest fields 
has been combined and as­
signed to the Ozona field.

Location is 660 feet from 
the north and east lines of 
25-M-GC&SF'.

----------- oOn-----------
Rev. and Mrs. Leland 

Wyatt and sons of Hern­
don, Virginia, are in Ozona 
this week visiting Mrs. Wy-

CROCKETT COUNTY 
HOSPITAL MEMORIAL 

FUND
List of donors to the 

Crockett County Hospital 
Memorial Fund since May 
18, 1965:

Leta and Clinton Glover 
of Abilene ini memory of 
Mr. Hugh Childress, Sr.,

Mr. and Mrs. Madden J. 
Read in memory of Mrs. 
Pon Seahorn and Mr. Hugh 
Childress, Sr.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Black, Jr., in memory of 
Mrs. Pon Seahorn and Mr. 
Hugh Childress, Sr.

Mr. and Mrs. Vic Mont­
gomery in memory of Mr.- 
Hugh Childress, Sr., Mr. 
George Cranfill, and Mr. 
George Haug of Marlin, fa­
ther of Mrs. Arthur Kyle.

Mr. and 'Mrs. Oscar Kost 
in memory of Mrs. Pat Lee 
Mrs. Ada Brown, Mrs. A. K. 
Bailey, Mr. Armond Hoover, 
Sr., Mr. Bill Hoover, Sr., 
Mrs. A. C. Hoover, Mr. Geo. 
Cranfill, Mr. George Haug, 
Mrs Pon Seahorn, and Mr. 
Hugh Childress, Sr.

Dr. and Mrs. Joe B. Lo­
gan in memory of Mr. Hugh 
Childress, Sr.
att’s mother Mrs. J. T. Kee­
ton.

need to identify yourself— 
she knew you the minute 
she heard your voice. If it 
were a wrong toll charge, a 
balky telephone instrument 
or some other service or in­
formation you w a n t e d ,  
Claudie’s soft voice would 
reassure you — and if any­
body icould move the cum­
bersome machinery of the 
“headtless” cor p o r a t i o n.

chologically disturbed” — 
now there are those who 
advocate the destruction of 
bars against intermarriage 
of the races and interracial 
adoption of children.
We can not agree that such 
'action is necessary in order 
to assure the Negro his 
rights nor to in any way 
grease the way of the white 
man or black man i n t oger, Mr .and Mrs. George 

Hunger, Mrs. S. M. Harvick | We can only recall
were wedding guests for the | announced aims of
wedding in San Antonio, | ĵ̂ g communists are being 
Millspaugh - Brix Andersen | laccomplished one by one in 
June 9th.

-oOo-
America mostly with the 
help of misguided do-good- 

3-Piece Sectional. G o l d ,  gj.̂
Nylon Cover. Water Dam- j _______^ qq---- -------
aged. Reg. price $329.95. A i The power of pictures is 
good buy at $200. Brown’s  ̂iveness of ^eed catalogs. — 
Furniture Co, lc| Oxford (Penna.) Item.

ijaĝ a’a m rcH li liillilnl i il ill |ii||iflaagmfeflaagEB8Ji

See the NEW High Quality Low Cost

HOME CRAFT

/

Five Protoctioxi €laest
PROTECT YOUR VALUABLE PAPERS FROM FiRE
Y our Bonds — Insurance Policies -  Notes — M ortgages -  Contracts 
Incom e T ax  Receipts — Birth Certificate -- D ischarge Papers — 
Leases — Rent Receipts -  Y our W ill — Livestock Registration Papers 
C ancelled Checks — Stamp and Coin Collections, and m any other 
things o f  personal and sentimental value, which w ould be destroy­
ed (an d  could  not be rep lace) if you had a fire. There is one about 
every 20 seconds.

tic-Pacific Triangle” provi- ( 
sions stand between us and 
the influx of thousands of 
Red Chineise agents. In eli­
minating this national se­
curity factioT, the proposed 
law would open our gates 
to a flood of hundreds of 
t h o u s a n d s  of Chinese, 
whose "backgrounds could 
not be adequately checked 
by an army of investigat­
ors.

“Thus”, says Liberty Lob- j 
by, ‘th‘e ‘Trojan Horse’ of j 
immigration will have pen- | 
etrated cur defenses . . . our 
future againslt Communism 
will be compromised.”

And just in case this 
reckless replacement for the 
M c 0 a r T e n Walter Act 
should get out of commit­
tee, every American who 
idherishes his freedom for 
himself and his offspring 
had better make his senti­
ments known to his Con­
gressman 'and both Sena- 
toi .̂

P U B L IC  NOTICE 
Proposed CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENT

-oOo-

Screworm Fund 
Drive Doubles 
^300,§00 Goal

Made of heavy gauge steel inside and 
out, all electric welded, between these 
si eel walls is 1V2 inches of solid Fire 
Proof Vermiculite Insulation which has 
over 300,000 tiny air ceils to the square 
inch. It has the universally used toque 
and gioove principle around the door 
with lV2-inch fireproof seal completely 
around'it. Outside dimensions Hxll'V^x 
7VL inches. Inside dimensions S'V^xllx 
4V2 inches. Equipped with heavy stand­
ard type key lock, with two keys. Very 
attractive gray finish.

YOURS FOR

ONLY $22.95
HOME CRAFT 

FIRE PROTECTION CHEST

Everyone Can Afford This New FIRE PROTECTION CHEST at Such a Low Price —

The Ozona Stockman
Phone 392-2551 — W e ’ll Save One For You

fvllssion — F'armers and 
ranchers in Texas were ask­
ed to contribute $300,000 
to help finance the screw- 
worm eradication program 
throug'h July 1. Last week,

, the S o u t h w e s t  AnimrJ 
.Heiatth Research Founda- 
: ticn announced that this 
 ̂goal had not only been met, 
but “had. praicticaTIy been 
doubled.

Completing a final coun­
ty - by - county 'tabulation, 
the Foundation’s board cf 
trustees d i s c 1 o s e d that 
$585,000 had 'been raised in 
Texas. Another $45,000 was 
collected in Oklahoma and 
$9,800 in New Mexico. Con­
tributions v/ere also report­
ed from Arkansas, Louis­
iana, Mississippi, Kan so j 
and Indiana.

----------- oOo------------
Mr. and Mrs. Van Miller 

are back for the summe-' 
after attendingi Southwe  ̂
Texas State Colleige in San 
Mai'cos, where they plan to 
resume their studies this 
fall.

------------oOo----------- -
FOR SALE — Marquett 

i Battery Changer. Charges 6 
or' 12 volt systems. Used 
very little See Lloyd Loud- 
amy at Loudomy’s Fashion 
Shoppe in the Viliage Shop­
ping Center.

----------- oOo------------
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Da- 

vee moved to Ozona from 
Balmorhea last week. Mr. 
Davee will take over as Vo-. 
oa)}ion'a Agriculture teacher 
at Ozona High School July 
1.

------------o Oo------------
Mr. and Mrs. Huey In­

gram and lohildren have 
been on vacation during 
the past two weeks during 
which time t h e y  visited
the World Pair.

PROPOSED C O N S T I T U ­
T I O N A L  AMENDMENT 
TO BE VOTED ON AT AN 
ELECTION TO BE HELD 
ON SEPTEMBER 7, 1965. 
SENATE JOINT RESOLU­

TION NO. 44 proposing an 
Amendment to Sections 2 and 
25 of Article III of the Consti­
tution of the State of Texas so 
as to provide for an increase 
in the membership of the State 
Senate from 31 to 39 niembers; 
to fix the membership in the 
House of Representatives at 
150 members; to require ap­
portionment of the Senate ac­
cording to population; and to 
delete the limitation that, no 
single county is entitled to 
moi’e than one Senator.
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE 

LEGISLATURE OF THE 
STATE OF TEXAS:
Section 1. That Sections 2 

and 25 of Article III of the 
Constitution of the State of 
Texas be amended to read re­
spectively as follows:

“ Section 2. The Senate shall 
consist of 39 members. The 
House of Representatives shall 
consist of 150 members.

“ Section 25. The state shall 
be divided into Senatorial Dis­
tricts of contiguous territory 
according to population, as 
nearly as possible.

“ Should the Legislature en­
act any enabling legislation in 
anticipation of this Amend­
ment, no such law shall be 
void by reason of its anticipa­
tory nature.

“ This Amendment shall be­

come effective upon its adop*- 
tion.”

Sec. 2. The foregoing Con­
stitutional Amendment shall 
be submitted to a vote of the 
qualified electors of this state 
at an election to be held on the 
7th day of September, 1965, at 
which election all ballots shall 
have printed on them the fol­
lowing:

“FOR the Constitutional 
Amendment increasing the 
membership of the State 
Senate from 31 to 39 
members, retaining the 
present membership of the 
House of Representatives, 
requiring appoi'tionment 
of the Senate according to 
population, and deleting 
the limitation that no 
single county is entitled 
to more than one Senator." 
“AGAINST the Constitu­
tional Amendment increas­
ing the membership of the 
State Senate from 31 to 89 
members, retaining the 
present membership of the 
House of .Representatives, 
requiring apportionment 
of the Senate according to 
population, and deleting 
the limitation that ‘ no 
single county is entitled to 
more than one Senator.”  
Sec, 3. The Governor of the 

State of Texas shall issue the 
necessary proclamation for the 
election and this Amendment 
shall be published in the man­
ner and for the length of time 
as required by the Constitution 
and laws of this state.

Phone news to Stockman

p l e a s e ;
WATCH OUT FOR KIDS!
Vacation has released 2,500,000 Texas chil­
dren from classrooms . . .  from discipline of 
safety patrols and supervised play. . .  from 
car pools and buses.
Help them have a summer of fun . . .  prevent 
a season of sorrow.
Let’s have them on hand for school in Sep­
tember, Safe.

A Community Service of your 
Oil and Gas Industry in Texas

OZONA OIL COMPANY
FINA PRODUCTS
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Shop At Foodway! Youli Like the Change ‘ ‘We Mean ike Savings of Course”
WE INVITE THE NEW BRIDES TO MAKE THEIR FOOD DOLLARS GO FARTHER — MAKE FOODWAY THEIR HEADQUARTERS —
YOU CAN DEPEND ON US. THAT’S WHY WE SAY — YOU SAVE MONEY ON FOOD AT FOODWAY

.. _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _  “ Where You Find The Best For Less!”
FAMILY STYLE FOODWAY QUALITY FINE FOR BROILING!

CHUCK STEAK 59c

PLUS THOSE VALUABLE FRONTIER STAMPS

CONVENIENCE FOODS 
Tasty, Quick, and Easy To Fix

WILSON’S PACKAGED REG. 29c & 33c 6 OZ. PKG. GOOCH PORTIONED

LUNCH MEAT BEEF STEAK 79c
GOOCH GERMAN STLYE

SAUSAGE
PORK (END CUTS)

12 OZ.
CRYOVAC PKG. LOIN ROAST IB 59c

FOODIVAY QUALITY

BEEF
COMPARE & SAVE

Jm

%

D airy Values LARGE SELECTIONS OF NATIONS BEST 
I SWEET JUICY

Kimbells Oven Ready Biscuits 6 cans 3 io  ||| Watermelons EACH 79c
NEW TENDER TEXAS

m  Bordens Buttermilk
m

a  Bordens Cottage Chese
l/o Gal. Carton 39s 1 DreoH BoaHS lb. 15c

^  Bordens Ice Cream Vi gal
Borden’s Sherbert 

fli Full Cream Longhorn Cheese
Free V2 Gallon Drink with 
yi Gal. Borden’s Homo

C A N N E D  G O O D S  V A L U E S
LOOK WHAT (HALF A BUCK) WILL BUY AND 

YOU STILL HAVE SOME CHANGE!
DIAMOND CUT

GREEN BEANS No. 303 Can 4 Cam
DIAMOND CUT

NEW TENDER2 lb. Carton 41® p
carton fil0  ^  | [Texas Okra lb. 29c

NEW TEXAS FRESH

Blackeyed Peas lb. 15c
29c

iVINE RIPENED

KRAFT 714 OZ. PKG.

Macaroni Dinner 2 for 29e
KRAFT REGULAR 8 OZ. PKG.

Spaghetti Dinner 8 oz pk 230
KRAFT MILD AMERICAN 8 OZ. PKG.

Spaghetti Dinner 2 for 39c
KRAFT 7 OZ. PKG.

Chicken Noodle Dinner
KRAFT 15% OZ. PKG.

Pizza w/Cheese
KIMBELL’S

Pop Corn In Oil 9^2 oz jar 29 c
CAMPBELLS 21 OZ. CAN

Pork & Beans 2 for 39s
CAMPBELLS 21 OZ. CAN

B. B. Q. Beans 2 for 39®
CAMPBELLS

Beans w/Franks 16 oz can
KIMBELLS 15 OZ. CAN

Pork & Beans
QUIGGS YELLOW SAFFRON — Try Serving with 
Fried Chicken

R I C E
KIMBELLS NO. 300 CAN

Spanish Rice
KIMBELLS 24 OZ. CAN

Spaghetti w/lV
KIMBELLS 4 OZ. CAN

Tomatoes 12 OZ. CARTON

FRESH TEXAS

Goldei C orn 6 EARS 29d

4 for 39®
Try Ser

10 oz. pkg.
2 for

Spaghetti w/Meat Balls 39®
KIMBELLS 4 OZ. CAN

Vienna Sausage 2 for 39®
\N

2 for 39® 

V2 size can 39®  

IVl oz jar 49® 

3 oz jar 79®

DIAMOND GRATED 1/2 SIZE CAN

T U N A
HONEY BOY

Salmon
KIMBELL

Instant Tea
KIMBELL

Instant Tea

TOMATOES No. 1 Can 5 Cans
DIAMOND CUT

GREEN PEAS No. 303 Can 3 Cans
PECAN VALLEY EARLY

JUNE PEAS No. 303 Can 5 Cans
DIAMOND

Blackeyes w/Bacon No. 300 Can 5 Cans
DIAMOND SWEET

POTATOES No. 303 Can 4 Cans
DIAMOND CHUNK

PINEAPPLE No. 300 Can 2 Cans
DIAMOND CRUSHED

PINEAPPLE No. 300 Can 2 Cans
DIAMOND SLICED

PINEAPPLE No. 2 Can 2 Cans
DIAMOND PINEAPPLE

J U I C E 12 oz. Can 5 Cans
DIAMOND TOMATO

C A T S U P 12 oz. btl. 3 for
DIAMOND TOMATO

C A T S U P 18 oz. btl. 2 for

m CHICKEN — TURKEY — BEEF — MACARONI

m

14 OZ. PKG.
Morton’s Dinners 11 oz. pkg. 2 for §9® ^Chocolate Chip Cookies 39®

^  NABISCO HOME STYLE ---------------
APPLE — PEACH — OR CHERRY C L  1 I •

Morton’s Fruit Pies 22 oz. pkg. 2 for 69® w  Cookies
COUPON S

LIBBY’S -__________________

_________ ____________  KIxMBELL

^ t e g i^ s ^ h s t a n t  Coffee 6 oz jar 7 |g
II Instant Coffee 10 oz jar $| J 9  
§  Premium Saltines lb box 33®

9 n  Tk* O 1 -  NABISCO HOME STYLE 13 OZ. PKG.
I  Mortons Pot Pies 8 oz. pkg. 4 for 69® |  Cinnamon Sugar Cookies 390

CHICKEN — TURKEY — BEEF — SALISBURY — MEilT LOilF NilBISCO HOME STYLE CASHEW 13% OZ, PKG.

Libby Onion Rings 4 oz. pkg. 29® 
Ĥ i

Fruit Juice Drinks 6 oz. can 2 for 29(1
Pineapple-Orange, Pineapple-Grapefruit, Pineapple Rasberry, Tropical 
or Strawberry-Pineapple

SPECIALS

HEALTH & BEAUTY AIDS
98c SCHICK, MENTHOL OR REGULAR j 189c JOHNSON & JOHNSON
Shaving Cream 11 oz. 79c Baby P ow der 14 Oz. Can 79c

4 ^ * ^ . S T A P L E  v a l u e s

^  Chuck Wagon Coffee
m IMPERIAL

Pure Cane Sugar
PILLSBURY OR GOLD*" MEDAL

F L O U R
KIMBELL’S ALL-VEGETABLE

98c MISS BRECK
Hair Spray 13 Oz. Can 79c

Salad Oil
98c REGULAR HALO
Sham poo 11c o f f  label 79c

1 lb. pkg. 59®
5 lb. bag 49®
51b. bag 4 l s
Full Qt. 59®

25 Free Stamps 
with Purchase One Pound 

Klimbell All-Veg. Margarine
25 Free Stamps 

with Puinhase of One Pound 
Pace Gold Grown Sliced Bacon

Ij
with Purchase of One 20 Gal. 

Galvnize-Garbage Can

with Purchase of One Dozen 
Kerr Fruit Jars

/(o jtm m

with Purchase 50 lb. Bag 
Kimbells New Organic Fertilizers

with Purchase 50 Foot Roll 
Tru-Lite Garden Hose
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The en:gajgement and approaching marriage of 'Miss 
Barbara Baribee and Jesse Carroll Williams, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. G, W. Williams of Woafcherfofrd, has been an­
nounced. by Mr. and Mrs. Beal Bartbee, parents of the 
bride-elect. Miss Baribee is a graduate of Ozona High 
School, and a May graduated oif Texas T'ech while the 
prospective igrocm is a graduate of Weatherford High 
School and a senior at Texas Tech. The First Methodist 
Church of Ozona will be the sicene of the wedding which 
is to take place August 7.

Senator Tower 
Reports To Texas

By Senator John Tower
This week, on Monday, 1 

inltroduced in the Senate a 
measure that removes from 
the iSecretary of Labor jur- 
risdiction in determining 
when a state needfe foreign 
agroultural ŵ orkers. My bill 
would place that responsi­
bility wtih the state agency 
having primary concern 
with agricultural policies. 
In car State this would be 
the State Commissioner of 
Agriculture.

The bracero program, un-, 
der which Texas farmers, 
ranchers, and consumers 
benefited for many years, 
was not renewed this year. 
Last year more than 200,- 
000 foreign workers, most 
of them from our g o o d  
neighbor Mexico, enitered 
the United States to help 
harvest crops. This year on­
ly 1,500 have been allowed 
to enter. The results are 
well known. In California, 
for instance, valuable crops 
cf strawberries were plow­
ed. under because of the la­
bor shortage. Prices to con­
sumers on many farm pro- 
duice items have almost 
doubled, but the added mo­
ney did not go to farmers, 
Rather, the added cost re­
flects, in many instances, 
additional labor costs.

In 1950, of e a c h  $312 
spent on food by the aver­
age American, our farmers 
received $132. In 1964, on 
the other hand, the spread 
had; grown, according to the

National Council of Farmer 
Cooperatives, to such an ex­
tent that for every $517 
spent on food by the aver­
age American, the farmer 
received only $133. And ap­
parently the trend is con­
tinuing.

The Texas Employment 
Oommission bulletin for the 
Brownsville, Harlingen, San 
Benito area, and for Starr 
and' Hidalgo counties, indi­
cates that “the possibility 
of a farm' labor shortage 
exists, for harvesting spring 
vegetables.” As all Texans 
know this is a region of 
heavy agricultural produc- 
td'om, and a farm 1 a b o r 
Shortage here will hurt con­
sumers far and wide.

I do not ibelieve there is 
a single Texas farmer who 
would employ alien workers 
rattier than doimestic work­
ers if those domestic work­
ers were available for em­
ployment. But if they are 
not available, I do ndt be­
lieve we ougiht to a l l o w  
crops to rot in the fields 
with the resultant price in­
crease to consumers, just 
fos'Cause the wheels of the 
federal bureaucracy move 
,so slowly.

In a recent exchange of 
letters. Secretary of Labor 
Wirtz assured me he is 
w'orking with the Texas 
Smiploymeht Commission to 
“meet the labor needs of 
Texas growers.

But time is running out. 
We must act and act quick­
ly.

APARTMENTS for rent. 
Bills paid. Call 392-2731. tfe

I

>’

. . .  ...... I

For Appointment Cali 392-2031 |
!♦!

CLEAN-RITE

Rugs -  Upholstery

>; 

>;

FRANK A . P E R R Y , JR.
O zona, Texas

BEALL BARBEE, Owner and Manager

Ozona Wool &  Mohair Co.
Phone 392-2623

W O O L  M O H A I R

RANCH SUPPUES

Name Coordinator
M C For Miss W ool 
Pageant June 18

Odessa — A fashion coor­
dinator and master of cere­
monies for the Miss Wool of 
Texas pageant to be held 
here June 18 have b e e n  
named.

included among the 12 
finalists for the coveted ti­
tle are Miss Sandra Bess 
Whitaker, daughter of W. 
H. Whitaker, Ozena, Texas. 
She is a senior student at 
Southwest Texas State Col­
lege, San Marcos, Texas.

Don G. Carter, pageant 
director, isaid Mrs. Tom 
King will be fashion coor­
dinator and Franklin Ken­
nedy will be master of cere­
monies. Both are of Mid­
land.

Mrs, King has long been 
aotivo in the fashion world 
and is well known in the 
Permilan Basin. Kennedy 
ha.s played lead roles on 
BiX'adJway and in State Fair 
musical'j at Dallas.

Both will play vital roles 
in the mevement of th e  
pageant co - sponsored by 
the Texas Sheep and Goat 
Raisers Association of San 
Angelo, and Odessa Cham­
ber of Commerce.

Bach of the 12 finalists 
competing for the coveted 
title will work iclosely with 
Mrs. King during rehear­
sals prior to the pageant 
which will be at 8:00 p. m. 
in the Ector High School 
auditorium here.

During the pageant, Mrs. 
King, 'Who was highly suc­
cessful in a similar capacity 
in. the “Make K. Yourself 
with Wool” finals in San 
Marcos in January — ano­
ther aspect of TSGRA’s pro­
motional program, will do 
the fashion cemmentating 
and imparit perscaial bits cf 
information about each fin­
alist modeling a woolen 
wardrobe. ,

------------oOo-—--------
M artinezes H onor 
Teachers Leaving

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Mar­
tinez honored several mem­
bers cf the Ozona School 
faculty and their families 
who will be leaving Ozena 
this summer at a dinner at 
the El iSembrero Cafe Fri­
day night.

Those henored at the din­
ner were Mr. and Mrs. By­
ron Cleere and children, 
who will m.ove to San An­
gelo later this month; Mr. 
and Mrs. Fred Hickman and 
Children, who will be mov­
ing to Ft. Stockton early in 
July; Ml*, and Mrs. John 
Hobaugh, who plan to move 
to Norton in July, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ernest M. Bo-yd 
and children, wllio will move 
to Big Spring in July.

T S ^ G R A  M eeting 
Coincides W ith 
Miss W ool Pageant

The Texas Sheep and 
Goat Raiser's Association 
will conduct its summer 
quarterly meeting at the 
Lincoln H o t e l  in Odessa, 
June 18 and 19. The meet­
ing will be in conjunction 
with the Miss Wool of Tex­
as Pageant] the night of 
June 18 in Ector Hi g h  
School Auditorium in Odes­
sa.

Among subjects up for 
dLscussicn in the quarterly 
meeting will be a proposed 
new promotional program 
on lamb marketing.

Jerry Puckett represent­
ed the TS&GRA at the 
Southwest Animal Health 
Research Foundation meet­
ing in Mission when the 
Secretaries cf Agriculture 
of this country and Mexico 
met wtih them, a n d  will 
give a report on that meet­
ing.

Twelve Texas girls a re  
finalists in the Miss Wool 
program. The winner will 
represent the Texas wool 
and mohair industry during 
the ceminig year. Among the 
contestants is Miss Sandra 
Whitaker, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. W. H. Whitaker of 
Ozona.

----- -̂-------oO o--------------
Barbara Davidson daugh­

ter of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Tom 
Davidson, Ozona, Texas, has 
returned home for the sum­
mer. Miss Davidson spent 
the winter school term at­
tending the Selwyn School, 
Denton, Texas, where she 
was a student in the 10th 
grade. At the recent Com­
mencement exercises cf the 
school, she received the 
Mathematics-Science award 
for excellence in t h e s e  
fields.

--------------oO o------------- -
FOR RENT — 3-bedroom 

house. Wall to wail carpet­
ing, Garage. 501 8th St. a- 
crosis from the high school. 
Call H. W. Baker. 392-2031 
or 392-2792. 10-tfc.

DR. H. B. TANDY 
MEMORIAL FUND

List of donors to the Dr. 
H. B. Tandy Memorial Fund 
since May 25 th:

Mrs. Hilton North in me­
mory of Mrs. Pat Lee, Mr. 
Armopd Hoover, Sr., Mr. 
Bill Hoover, Sr., Mr. Buster 
Loudamy, Mrs. Pon Seahorn 
Mrs. A. C. Hoover and Mrs. 
D. W. Russell.

Mr. and Mrs. B. W. Stuart 
in memory of Mrs. P o n  
Seahorn and Mr. Hugh 
Childress, Sr.

Mr. a n d  Mrs. Arthur 
Phillips in memory of Mr. 
Bill Hoover, Sr., Mr. Ar- 
mond Hoover, Sr., Mrs. A, 
C. Hoover and Mrs. P on  
Seahorn.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Au- 
gu. t̂ine in memory of Mrs. 
Pon Seahorn.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Phil­
lips in memory of Mr. Hugh 

i Childress, Sr. and Mrs. Fay 
I Fitzgerald, Mr. Beall Bar­
bee’s aunt.

Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Bag­
gett, Sr. in memory of Mr. 
George Cranfill, Mr. Ed 
Cranfill’s father, and Mrs. 
W. P. Seahorn.

'Mrs. Ann McKnight in 
memory of Mr. Geo. Cran­
fill, and Mrs. Pon Seahorn.

(Mr. and Mrs. Early Bag­
gett in memory of Mrs. Pon 
Seahorn, and Mr. Hugh 
Childress, Sr.

------------oOo------------
DUPLICATE BRIDGE

Winners in Duplicate 
Bridge Club play Tuesday 
night at the country club 
were: First, Mr. and Mrs. 
Evailt White ; second, Mrs. 
Jess Marley and Mrs. Scott 
Peters of Austin; third, Mrs. 
James Dockery and Mrs. 
Jack Wilkins and fourth, 
Mrs. Jake Short and Mrs. 
Carl North.

--------------oO o------------- -
FOR SALE 4 Houses on 

Ave. I. 2-bedrooms. Carports 
and storage, At 106, 108, 110 
and 112 Ave. I. All rented 
now. S h o w n  by appoint­
ment only. Will sell all or in 
pairs. Delbert Stewart. Ph. 
392-2680 or 392-2230. 3-tfc.

OUR INTEREST RATE IS STILL

6 %
CHARGED ON DAILY OUTSTANDING 

BALANCE (SIMPLE)
FOR ALL AGRICULTURAL LOANS

Texas Production Credit Ass’n.
116 S. Oaks San Angelo, Texas

J. R, Canning, Pres, E. D. Webster, Dir.
R. C. Chandler, V-Pres. Aubrey Delong, Dir.
J. Burney Ligon, Dir. Lee Russell, Asst. Mgr.

Phil H. Lane, Mgr.

Ib u  don’t have to like golf to like 
our Buick "Swinging sS es Spree.”

Just driving. (And saving money.)

Proposed legislation to reduce excise tax on new passenger automobiles provides 
a refund o f such tax reduction where a passenger automobile is sold to a retail 
purchaser after May 14, 1965 and before July 1, 1965, when the excise tax reduc­
tion becomes eflfective. Where a refund is authorized by this legislation, General 
Motors Corporation will make a cash payment to such a purchaser in the 
amount of the excise tax reduction.
Enjoy your new Buick now!

There's an authorized Buick dealer near you. See his ^^ j^oub le-C hecked  used cars, too.

WOOTEN MOTOR CO.
516 9th Street OZONA, TEXAS 392-2691

Have something to sell or 
buy? Advertise it in the 
Stockman.

OZONA LODGE NO. 747

A. F. & M.
Reg. meeting on ; 
1st Mon. of mon.;

LATJDBATVJK
LOATJS

HELP WANTED —
Male or Female $65 week­

ly and more, for reliable 
man or woman to service 
customers in Ozona. Full or 
part time. No investment 
Write C, R. Ruble, Dept. 5- 
3, P. O. Box No. 2447, Mem­
phis, Tenn.

FOR S ALE — Crockett 
Hotel in Ozona. 18 rooms, 
furnished. See or call own­
er Jones Miller, Ph. 392- 
3203. 50-tfc.

Loans designed to meet 
the greater demands of 
land owners during these 
changing times are Land 
Bank loans. i
We make them In this area 
and will be pleased to ex* 
plain to you how one may 
well be the answer to your 
loan needs. '

SONORA, TEXAS 
Phone 24221

INSIST ON

S ervice  MASTER'
fhe responsible system

For Your Carpet 
Rug & Furniture 

Cleaning —
CALL

W .L. Mac Mckinney 
Ph. 653-3800
San Angelo

Houses For Sale
4 Bedroom — 15000.00 
3 Bedroom — $20,000.00 
3 Bedroom — $13,500.00 
3 Bedroom — $12,000.00 
and Up
l&S Bedroom Houses 

$3,000.00 and Up

M. Brock Jones
Real Estate 392-3152

DON'T SIMMER THROUGH SUMMER! 
STAY COMFORTABLY COOL

fo r
I m v s  A S  

$ 6 64
per fflontii

(aficr normal down payment!

Shut Out 
Hot Weather
Paramount DeVille
This is the new Paramount DeVille with the exclusive All 
Weather Control (Patented Window Closing Attachment) 
which lets you enjoy SOLID COMFORT ail year long. The 
control eliminates entry of drafts, rain or dust. And there's 
no need to remove the cooler in winter or re-install it in the 
spring—just drain the water, close and lock the window 
and forget it.

Patented No-Clog Sta-Fresh Filters are guaranteed 
clog-proof, w ith complete insect protection, assuring 
100% cooling efficiency all summer long.

Complete Air Direction Control. Air movement can 
be instantly altered to provide concentrated or diffused 
cooling or ventilating.

Two Speed Motor Control allows you to adjust cooling 
or ventilating capacity to suit comfort needs.

Push Button Pump Control pre-wets the filters, pro­
viding instant cooling by eliminating the dry, hot dusty air 
during the first few minutes of operation.

OTHER POINTS OF SUPERIORITY
9  1Q0% HOT-DIPPED GALVANIZED STEEL UNI-WELDED CONSTRUC­

TION
•  BAKED ENAMEL FINISH
•  MOTOR AND BLOWER WHEELS CUSHIONED IN RUBBER
•  ADJUSTABLE MOTOR MOUNTS
•  HIGH MOUNTED MOTORS— PROTECT AGAINST MOISTURE
•  BRONZE, OIL-IMPREGNATED BEARINGS
•  DYNAMICALLY BALANCED BLOWER WHEELS
•  UNOBSTRUCTED WATER RESERVOIRS

EXTRA  LARGE SQ U IR R EL  CA GE BLOW ER PUTS  
OUT LARGE QUANTITY OF AIR AT SLOW, QUIET SPEED.

See the Paramount DeVille evaporative cooler at your WTU office. 
Normal installation Free for WTU residential customers.

.See the Buick exhibit at the General Motors York World's Fair

"Wfest Texas Utilities 
Company \“an invedtor owned company"

'-----1------------------------
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The News Reel
A re-run of 

“The Ozona Story” 
as gleaned from the files of 

The Ozona Stockman
June 11, 1936

Len Mertz recently sold 
4400 yearling ewes to West 
Bros. & Carson Crockett 
county ranchers, at $6.50 a 
head, June 20tih delivery.

—30 years ago—
Ed Bean recently sold the 

Massie Ranch wool clip of 
75,000 pounds at 321/2 cents 
a pound.

—30 years ago—
It's rare that a newspa­

per has ‘flowers’ for the 
proposition but the Stock- 
mian hastens to compliment 
its “opposition” on a splen­
did special edition boosting 
Ozona’s annual stock show 
and rodeo in July. The sheet 
“The Ozona Rodeo News— 
Gathered, Wrtten and Pu­
blished by Miles Pierce, was 
published in Miles’ “Globe 
Print Shop” owned and op­
erated by Miles ^Pierce in 
his basement. The edition 
was well filled with ads, in­
cluding one f r o m  The 
Stockman which modestly 
admitted to being t h e  
“NEXT BEST paper in Cro­
ckett county.” i

—30 years ago— 
“How’d you mark?” or 

“Got many wormles?” is 
the language of the West 
Texas sheepman, but in 
California it’s “How’s your 
fruit crop?” says J. W. O- 
wens, just back from the 
Sacramento ram sale. When 
a Californian asked him a- 
bout Texas friut Mr. Owens 
said he t o 1 d him a fe*w 
ranches might have a peach 
tree or two but usually the 
late frosts killed the fruit 
buds anyway.

—30 years ago—
Mr. and Mrs. Claude Hud­

speth were up from their 
ranch for a few days visit 
in Ozona this week.

—30 years ago— 
Rcsalee Lemmons, small 

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Lemmons, is recovering 
from a broken collar bone 
suffered recently while at 
play.

—30 years ago—
Pink Beall underwent a 

tonsilectcmy here last week.
—30 years ago—■

Mr. and Mrs. H. L. Mans­
field and children of Band- 
era are here for a visit with 
Mr. and Mrs. Jake Short 
and with Rev. and Mrs. Ira 
Garrison of Ozona. Mrs. 
Mansfield is a cousin of 
Rev. Garrison.

—30 years ago—■
Mrs. Mark Taliaferro suf­

fered a cracked vertebra in 
her neck Sunday night 
when the family car over­
turned on a slick road on 
t h e J. C. Montgomery 
ranch. Mr. and Mrs. Talia­
ferro and Mr. Taliaferro’s 
m o t h e r  were returning 
from the Chisos mountains 
Where they had visited a 
son aJt a OOC camp.

—30 years ago— 
Mumps are going the 

rounds in the home of Or. 
and Mrs. H. B. Tandy.

—30 years ago—
Mr. and Mrs. George Bean 

have returned from San 
Angelo with their daugh­
ters, Louise and Doris, who

have had their tonsils re­
moved in a San Angelo cli­
nic.

------------oOo----------- -

Calendar of Events 
For June, 1965

10 — Ladies Golf Associa­
tion meets for bridge; Lions 
Club meets at noon; Little 
League.

11-14— B̂apltist GA Camp 
at Paisano Encampment, 
Alpine.

13-18 —• Woman’s Club 
GFWC Tour of Europe, 
North Africa, Holy Lands

Near East.

14 — Little League
15 — Rotary Club at noon
16 — Ladies Golf Asso­

ciation meets.
17 —■ Ladies Golf Associa­

tion meets for bridge; Lions 
Club; Southside Lions Club; 
Little League.

18 — Bill Canto Chorus 
from Boles Home, Quinlan, 
Texas at Church of Christ, 
7:30 p. m.

21 — Little League.
21-26 — Methodist VBS.
22 — Rotary Club
23 — Ladies Golf Asso­

ciation meets.
24 — Ladies Golf 'Asso­

ciation meets for bridge; 
Lions Club; Little League

I 28 — Little League, 
j 29 — Rotary Club meets, 
j 30 — Ladies Golf Associa- 
j tion meets.1 ------------oOo----------- -
iSELL KNAPP AEROTRED 

SHOES FULL TIME OR 
PART TIME

Excellent weekly earnings 
sellings famous nationally 
advertised K n a p  p Air- 
Oushioned Shoes. Complete 
line for men and women. 
Daily commissions p l u s  
monthly bonus. Paid insur­
ance benefits. Here is your 
opportunity for financial 
independence is a profitable 

/business of your own, or to 
'earn extra cash. Selling e-

quipment furnished free. 
Territories now open in O- 
zona surrounding areas and 
thr o u g h o u t surrounding 
counties. Write to E. M. Bis- 
tow, Kimpp Shoe, Brockton, 
Mass. 02402. 9-5c

------------ uOo------------

Western Mattress 
Company

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS 
Save 50% on having your 

mattress renovated 
— All Work Guaranteed —

PICK UP & DELIVERY
In Ozona Twice a Month 

Call 392-2166

O ur new home 
will be paid for 
by the time our 
children finish 
high school

Thanks to Jim Walter's 
12 year finance plan.

The many families who bought their homes from 
Jim Walter just a few short years ago will soon 
be mortgage free. More than 100,000 families 
have found happiness and security through Jim 
Walter’s building and financing plan. If you 
own your lot, you pay nothing down for the home 
of your choice. Easy monthly payments are ar­
ranged to suit your budget. Send for our nev/ full 
color catalog now. It's FREE!

Call Collect or Write To d a y!

JIM WALTER CORPORATION
(Mail to the nearest office)
I would like to know more about your building and 
financing plan. Please send me a free catalog. I am 
interested in a . . .

□  Home □  Cottage

NAME________________________________________ -
ADDRESS_______________________________________
CITY______________ -STATE.
Telephone------------------------
My building lot is loccsfed in. .Coonty.

A bilene, Texas 
Hwy. SO East 

P. O. Kox 1427 
P h on e; OR 3-6495

WE ARE OPEN ON SUNDAY
San A n ton io , Texas 

H w y.90 E .m i E.Lp. 13 
P. O. B ox 846 

P h on e : MO 1-2348

P h on e : EM 6-8817 
Odessa, Texas 

5005 E. H wy. 80 
P. O. B ox 338

I

JANES FUNERAL HOME

802 Avenue E

DEDICATED TO SERVICE

24-Hour Ambulance Service 
Phone 392-3202

% W H O  B A T S  F I R S T B a

THE CH URCH  FOR ALL
ALL FOR THE CHURCH

The Church is the greatest factor 
on earth for the building of charac­
ter and good citizenship. It is a store­
house of spiritual values. Without a 
strong Church, neither democracy 
nor civilization can survive. There 
are four sound reasons why every 
person should attend services regu­
larly and support the Church. They 
are: (1) For his own sake. (2) For 
his children’s sake. (3) For the sake 
of his community and nation. (4) 
For the sake of the Church itself, 
which needs his moral and material 
support. Plan to go to church regu- 
larl5' and read your Bible daily.

Part of playing any game is to learn how to settle the inevitable argu­
ments. In a league in which nobody has a coin to toss, this is the time- 
honored method for getting the game started without a squabble.

But there are other games to be played, in other leagues. Life for each 
of us brings many occasions for conflict. And they don’t all yield to simple 
techniques like twirling a bat around one’s shoulders with just a couple 
of fingers.

Earnest Christians believe that our faith can point men to the right 
attitude and action in times of stress.

That’s why, as we face the conflicts of life, we always hope the other 
fellow will behave like a Christian. And he’s hoping as much of us.

Why not meet him in Church next Sunday? That’s where right attitudes 
often begin.

Copyright 1965 Keister Advertising Service, Inc., Strashurg, Vet.

Sunday
Matthew
18:21-35

Monday
Marie

9 :33-41

Tuesday
Ephesians
4 :22-33

Wednesday
Philippians

2:1-11

Thursday
Philippians
2 :14-18

Friday
Colossians

2 : 1-6

Saturday 
I Timothy 
6 :3-10

t t d̂2? t t 2̂2? t t 2̂2̂  t <S22? t <512> t
This Series of Ads is Being Published and Sponsored by the Following Ozona Business Establish­
ments and Individuals in the Interest of a Stronger Community.

Hi-Way Cafe 
Ozona T V  System 
Evans Foodway 
Wooten Motor Co.
Flying W  Cage Eggs

Bradbury’s — In the Village Ozona Butane Co.

Ranch Feed &  Supply Co. 
Sutton’s Chevron Station

South Texas Lumber Co. 
of Ozona

Meinecke Ins. Agency 

Glynn’s Shell Station 

Whitens Auto Store
In The Village

Ozona National Bank 

Ozona Oil Company

Stuart Motor Co. 
Ozona Stockman
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Si. Luke’s Episcopal Church In 
San Antonio Setting for Wedding of 
Linda Millspaugh, Niels Andersen

Bishop Earl R. Discus and 
Rev. Henry Getz officiated 
at the high noon marriage 
ceremony Oif Miss Linda 
Mae Millspaugh and Lt. 
Niels Brix Andersen Wed­
nesday, June 9, at St. Luke’s 
Episcopal Church in San 
Antonio.

The bride is the daughter 
of Mrs. Sidney Millspaugh,

cluster of thalanopsis orc­
hids on a white prayer book.

The bridemaids wore blue 
empire linen dresses and 
carried white violets.

The pre-nuptial music 
wias “The Wedding Prayer” 
by Williams, and St. Luke’s 
quartette s a n g the Com-  ̂
munion service.

After the wedding break-
Jr., of Ozona and San An- fast at the San Antonio
tonio, and the l a t e  Mr. 
Milfep*augh.

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Brix 
Andersen Oif Larchmont, 
New York, are the parents 
of the brigeroom.

Sterling Baker, Sonora, 
gave his granddaughter a- 
Way 'and was assislted by the 
bride’s cousin, Dwight L. 
Hunter, Junior, Dallas. Miss 
Marilyn Baker Millspaugh 
was her sister’s maid-of- 
honor. Miss Jeannette Sea- 
,!man B u s h  was a bride’s 
maid and Miss Lucy Roe 
Hunter, the junior brides­
maid. Miss Bush and Miss 
Hunter are the bride’s cou­
sins and both are from Dal­
las.

Jans B r i x Andersen, 
ta.rohmont, N. Y. served his 
brother as best mani. Ron­
ald Barry, Houslton and 
Sidney Sanderson Mills­
paugh, III, were grooms­
men. Dr. Conrad T. Hole- 
kamp, II, Junction, and 
John Hunter Trolinger, San 
Angelo, were the ushers and 
the bride’s cousins.

Flower girls were Laurie 
La Verne and Dorra Kath- 
lee::i Holekamp, and Con­
rad T. Holekamp, III, was 
the ring bearer.

The bride was lovely in 
her short dress of imported 
silk linen. Styled w i t h  a 
jbateau neckline and brief 
shoulder, summer sleeves, 
the slim line dress artfully 
featured a tiered tunic 
Skirt. A trio of silken roses 
held her tiered French illu­
sion veil, and she carried a

'Country Club the couple 
left for a wedding trip to 
Nassau, land will be at home 
later at McGuire A. F. B., 
New Jersey.

Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Mc- 
Dougal enter'tained th e  
bride and groom Monday 
evening with a pre-nuptial 
pool side dinner party at 
their country home near 
Leon Springs.

Mr. and Mrs. Alex Brix 
Andersen, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dwight L. Hunter, Jr., and

L E G A L  N O T I C E  
NOTICE TO BIDDERS

The Comimissioners Court 
of Crockett County, Texas, 
will receive sealed bids un­
til 1C o’clock a. m., June 24, 
1965, at which time bids 
will be publicly opened and 
read, at the Court House, 
Ozona, Texas, for Air Con­
ditioning and Heating re­
visions at the Crockett 
County Medical Building.

Plans and specifications 
may be obtained from Le- 
ta Powell, County Clerk, 
Crockett County, Texas.

The Commissioners Court 
reserves the right to accept 
or reject any or alt bids 
submitted.

Dick Kirby 
County Auditor 

12-2tc
------------ o Oo------------

STOR-ALL Boxes at The 
Stockman office.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Bush 
entertained the wedding 
party and out-of-town wed­
ding guests with a cocktail 
buffet in the St. Anthony’s 
Preaux Room.

Indians Drop One 
A t Ballinger On 
Ead-H op Single

A fluke single that could 
just as well been the final 
out of the inning and an 
Ozona victory, paved th e  
way for the Ballinger In­
dians to edge the Ozona In­
dians 6 to 4 in Ballinger 
Sunday afternoon.

Ozona got to Ballinger 
ace Clyde Escobar early and 
.scored four runs but the 
Ballinger rally, higihlighted 
by the bad hop single, kept 
the homie team’s winning 
streak going.

A safe bunt, a walk, a 
single, an error and an in­
field out pushed three runs 
home for the Ozona team 
in the second inning and a 
single, an error and ano­
ther single produced the 
fourth run in the s i x t h  
iframe.

Ballinger scored one in

Barbara Barbee 
Honored At Party

Miss Barbara B a r b e e  
bride-elect of Jesse Wil­
liams. was honored with a 
garden party Friday at the 
J. W. Howell home at 614 
Coate,s Street.

Hostesses were Mrs. Ho­
well, Mrs. Wayne W. West, 
Mrs. Otti'St Pridemore and 
Mrs. Larry Albers.

Decorations on the des­
sert table were carried out 
in the bride’s chosen colors 
of blue and white.

The bonoree was present­
ed a gift of cookbooks from 
the hostesses.

Mrs. Beal Bartbee, the 
bride-elects mother was a 
special guest.

LOUDAMY’S 
FASHION SHOPPE
In The Village Center

the first, one in the third, 
and two in the fourth to go 
ahead before Ozona tied it 
in the sixth. Then came the 
decisive rally in the eighth.

S A V E  $$ S A V E  $$

DR. EDWARD A. CAROE
OPTOMETRIST

• EYES EXAMINED
• GLASSES FITTED

• LENSES REPLACED

But we do it right!

WATCH
For Our

217 So. Chadbourne San Angelo, Texas Ph. 655-5384

Now Ready —
Greenhouse Tomatoes

VINE RIPENED
For Sale at

607 Ave. G.

Sam Fitzhugh

PRE -  SUMMER SALE

Dresses -  Hats -  Bags, etc 

Coming Soon!

Loudamy’s Fashion Shoppe
In The Village

OZONA, TEXAS

feel pretty... 
feel 

female

Efeg«nc« for milady 
this Antron® nylon 
tricot slip with Alen- 

con-t/pe lace. Underbusf 
section is fashioned of 

gleaming Antron® satin.
Sizes 30-38 Short 32-40 

Averege/ 34-40 Tall in 
snow white, black, pearl, 

apricot*/ carib blue*
$6.00

cind Average only

the “ Liaison Fit-Together'” Collection

TOIAY IS THE TENTH!
This is a red letter day to the merchants who have been 
generous and kind in extending credit to those who 
have needed ‘Things’  ̂ -  whether they have been lux­
uries or necessities -  and now it is our solemn obliga­
tion as customers, to pay for this help and courtesy ex­
tended.

We are all only too happy to accept the favor -  
To charge it now -  and pay it later -  
But when the 10th eventually comes Tound -  
Are we there with the money -  or can we be found?

It is only the right and American way of life -  
That we pay ^̂ as agreed’ -  and not get ‘ ‘the knife” -  
The “knife of our credit experience” -  when bad -  
It’s a record that is kept and can readily be had.

So let us ponder, plan and pledge our support -  
To pay our obligations — and have a good report — 
Because when the “ inquirers” come asking about you -  
The Bureau won’t need to report -  “ his accounts are 
past due.”

The following business and professional men are members of R. M. A . of Ozona:

Janes Funeral Home

Dr. E. L. Dyer
Evan’s Food way
Ozona Dress Shop
Ozona Automotive Supply Co.
Ozona National Bank
North Grocery
Cisneros Grocery And Market 
Smith Drug Company 
B & B Food Store 
Dub’s Conoco Service Station” 
The Baggett Insurance Agency 
Dr. M. A . Lemmons

Ozona Oil Company 
Woody Mason Motor Co.
Sutton Chevron Station 
Hi-Way Cafe
Crockett County Water Control 
Ozona Butane Company 
Pioneer Natural Gas 
Watson’s Dept. Store 
Knox Motor Company 
Fred Chandler, Jr. Co. Attorney 
The Brown Furniture Co. 
(formerly Ratliff’s)

Crockett County Hospital 
Dr. Ralph E. Simon, Jr.
Dr. L. H. Sherrill 
Dr. Joe B. Logan 
Foxworth-Galbraith Lbr. Co. 
General Telephone Company 
of the Southwest 
Village Drug Store 
Baker Jewelers 
Bradbury’s 
Ramirez Grocery,
A1 Ramirez, mgr.

The Loudamy Fashion Shop 
West Texas Utilities Company 
Thorp’s Laun-Dry
South Texas Lumber Co.
M &  M Cafe
Leo’s Humble Service Station 
Kyle Kleaners
Whites Auto Store — John Fowler 
Maxine’s Flower Shop 
Wooten Motor Company 
Dr. Noble Price 
Dr. W . B. Robertson 
The United Dept. Store

BUY WISELY! PAY PROMPTLY!

RETAIL MERCHANTS ASSOCIATION
Ozona, Texas
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Mrs. Ted Covington 
. . . nee Diane Couch

Diane Couch,
Ted Covington 
Wed In Angelo

Miss Diane Couch, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs, Joe 
Couch of Ozona, became 
the bride of Ted Michael 
Covington of San Angelo 
in a ceremony Wednesday 
June 2, in the Lake View 
MethOjdist Church.

Mr. aird Mrs. C, E. Cov- 
inglton of San Angelo are 
parents of the bridegroom.

The Rev. Arthur Foster, 
officiated. Attending the 
couple were Mr. and Mrs. 
Jon Patterson of San An­
gelo.

The bride is a graduate 
of Ozona High School with 
the class of 1965, Her hus­
band is a senior student at 
Texas Technological Col­
lege in Lubbock.

The couple will live in 
San Angelo this summer. 

------------oOo----------- -
LOST — One Siamese cat, 

male 4 to 5 years old. Has 
jeweled collar, disappeared 
from ranch. Return to Ar- 
mond Hoover, Jr. 12-3tc 

------------oOo------------
Mrs. Mary Moore, w'ho 

teaches at South Elemen­
tary, left Friday for Den­
ton where she will attend 
North Texas State Univer­
sity this summer.

Ozona Oilers 
Down Ranchers 
In L;L Opener

By Ernie Boyd
I  The Ozona Oilers jumped 
into first place in the sec­
ond half of Little Leaigue 
play Monday night when 
ithey rattled the Flyinig W 
Ranchers 12 to 3 in the first 
meeting of the two con­
tenders in this half of play.

David Williams went the 
route for the Oilers and, 
outside of a shaky s t a r t  
When the Ranchers picked 
up two runs and a tower- 

‘ ing home run by Alex Gar­
za in the fourth frame af­
ter the game was out of 
reach, Williams was in firm 
control.

Leading 3 to 2 in th e  
third frame, the Oilers put 
together several solid raps, 
a couple of infield scratch­
es and four Rancher er­
rors to push across seven 
runs and sew up the game.

David Pagan led the ai,s- 
.sault for Ozona Oil with a 
heme run, a double and a 
single.

In last Thursday night’s 
games, which opened play 
in the second half. Flying 
W walloped Moore Oil 11 
to 1. Tiny Rivera limited 
the Oilers to two hits as he 
coasted home in four in- 

jnings behind the eleven- 
i run barrage of his t e a m 
I mates.I Ozona Oil, keeping pace 
I with Flying W, crushed B 
I &B. 12 to 0 in four frames, 
j Williams went all the way 
for O z o n a  Oil, giving up 

1 four widely scattered hits 
and striking out 7. David 
Pagan and Philip Perner 
each had perfect days at 
bat with Perner adding a 
home run in the winning 
cause.

In the consolation brack­
et B&E dumped Moore Oil 
12 to 4 as B&B used, three 
pitchers who gave up 9 hits, 
Even though B&B garnered, 
only 4 hits the tâ ase on balls 
made up the difference as 
the Grocers coasted h o m e  
with the win.

------------oOo------------
I will accept piano pupils 

for the suimmei'. Hymns, po­
pular and classical music . . 
Jan Pridemore Ph. 392-2038

Roberta Johnigan 
Gets Degree From 
Hardin-Simmons

Roberta Joiinigan, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Hart­
ley Johnigan of Ozona, re­
ceived h e r  Bachelor of 
Science degree in elemen­
tary education from Hardin 
Simmoiiis University l a s t  
week.

While attending Hardin 
Simmons, Roberta v/as a 
member of Alpha Ghi, na­

Brows Fiirniliire Company

'^Everything For The Home’

Furniture, Appliances, Carpet

Phone 392-2341

Crockett Field 
Gains Discovery

C. L. Norsworthy, Jr., 
Dallas No. 1 C. T. Harris, 
Crockett County Pennsyl­
vanian detrital disicovery 10 
miles northeast of I r a a n  
and six miles west of the 
Escondido (Pennsylvanian, 
Fusselman and Ellenbur- 
ger) field, was finaled for 
322 barrels of 41 gravity oil, 
plus 5 per cent acid water 
with gas-oil ratio of 700-1.

Production was through a 
28-64-inch choke and per­
forations • between 8,391- 
8,404 feet, which had been 
washed with 1,000 gallons 
of mud acid. Flowing pres­
sure was 875 pounds.

Slated as a 10,200-foot 
Ellenburger wildcat ,it was 
drilled to 10,075 feet and 
recovered sulphur water on

tional scholastic fraterni­
ty; Sigraa Tau Delta, na­
tional English fraternity, 
anjd Beta Gamma Epsilon, 
a s'ceial club.

She will teach in the Lub­
bock Public Schools this 
fall. .

----------- oOo----------- -
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Mosely 

and their children arrived 
in Ozona from Elgin late 
last week. Mr. Mosley will 
!be football coach at Ozona 
High School next fall.

A NEW HOME 
FOR Y O U ! !  
WHATEVER 

YOUR NEEDS
• A  Frame Cottage
• A  Rambling

Ranch
• A  Brick Colonial
• A  Vacation

House

WE PLAN 
WE FINANCE 

WE BUILD

National Building 
Centers, Inc.

Formerly Wm. Cameron 
Lumber Yards

Phone 22601 Sonora, Tex.

Garden of the Week
As Selected by 

Ozona Garden Club
Garden of the Week 

Mr. and Mrs.
Roy Henderson’s Yard 
------------oOo----- ------

The Avon Way 
1.3 'the profitable way 

To spend your free time 
And have money to spend 

Freely!
Write: Jeanetate Ohew, A- 
von Dist. Mgr. 1105 W. 12lh 
Brady, Texas.

a test at total depth.
Casing (41/2 - inch) was 

set at 8,508 feet.
Location is 1,980 feet 

from the north and 660 
fet from the east lines of 
3-HK-L&SV.

WATCH-CLOCK-JEWELRY
REPAIPv

CLARENCE KEY 
Ave. D — First House South 

Moore Motor Co.

NOTICE OF

REW ARD
I am offering

^500 Reward
for apprehension and con­
viction of guilty parties to 
every theft of livestock in 
Crockett County — except 
that no officer of Crockett 
County may claim the re­
ward.

Billy Mills
Sheriff, Crockett County

COMPLETE 
PLASTIC PLUMBING

SYSTEMS OF

POLYVINYL CHLORIDE

Do not confuse Genova pipe with thitt 
wot! underground sewer pipe. Genova 
pipe Is triple thick —  tfrIcH/ engl* 
neered and designed for Inside reif* 
denttal and commercial use.

hw&st in^t l̂ktfon cost 
corrosion and impact proof 
lightweight easy to handle

GUARANTEED!

SOUTH T E X A S  LU M BER CO M PAN Y
EVERYTHING TO BUILD ANYTHING 

We have Antiquing Sets for Woodwork and Furniture 
Spray and Brush on type

♦ d

1 STOR-ALL I 
i STORARE BOXES i

SEE THE U.S.A. 
THE NO. 1 WAY

Come on in. Have a plusli vinyl-covered bucket seat.
Stretch out and relax. You’ll find the ’65 Chevrolet gives 

you more room to live in.
And wait’ll you see what’s under the hood;
Living voom!
But the thing that should really get you going is the price of 

one of these racy Impala Super Sport Coupes or Convertibles*
The cost of living in one isn’t as high as it looks.

Red Hot and Rolling! See your Chevrolet dealer for a new CHEVROLET * c h e v e l l e  • CHEVYn  • CORVAIR

WOOTEN MOTOR CO.
O Z O N A  -  T E X A S

42-6494

WITH 100 AND 1 USES

Records — Clothes — Toys -  Stuff — Compact — Portable 
Extra Strong — Made of New FIBRE-COR 

Holds Up To 150 Pounds 
Both Letter or Legal Size Record Storage

SIZE 12” X15” X10” -  EXTRA STRONG

Use it to store Household or Office Records, Clothes |
H

Hats, Blankets, Remnants, Seasonal Use Materials !♦:
V

- , ■ II 
IVV

At The

ST0OKMAN
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Anniversar — Amendment

Mrs. Nat Read 
nee Miss Jean Powers

M iss Jean Pow ers N a t 
Read M arried Sunday

Mr. anidi Mrs. Nat Read 
«,re on a wedding trip to 
Oolorado this week follow- 
inig ,their marriage at the 
Read ranch home Sunday 
ervening.

Mrs. Read is the former 
Jean Powers, daughter of 
Mj. and Mrs. C. F. Powers 
of Siniton and a teacher in 
tho Ozona Puhlic schools.

Mr. Read is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Madden Read 
of Ozona and ranches in 
Crockett County.

The bride wore a street

length white lace dress. Ho­
nor attendants were Mrs. 
Ray McBride of Corpus 
Christi, sister of the bride, 
and Jim Read of Kanab, U- 
tah, brother of the groom.

A reception for those at­
tending the wedding was 
held in the Read home fol­
lowing the wedding.

Mrs. Read is a graduate 
df Baylor University while 
Mr. Read is a graduate of 
Sul Ross at Alpine. The 
couple plan to make their 
home on the Read ranch 
Southeast of Ozona.

NANNETTE BAILEY 
HONORED AT PARTY

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Bailey 
h o n o r e d  their daughter, 
Nannette, with a party at 
their ranch last week, with 
members of the 1965-66 O- 
zona High School freshman 
class as guests. Feasting 
and games were enjoyed 
during the day by 22 boys

I Out of town guests in- 
and girls of the class.

! eluded Margaret Simon, I  daughter of Dr. and Mrs. 
i Ralph Simon of Irving, for- 
, mer Ozonans, who is visit- 
! ing Chris Clegg, and Jerry 
i Lan gidcn, son of Railroad 
J Commissioner Jim Langdon 
and Mrs. Langdon of Austin 

I who is visiting Charles Chil­
dress.

(Continued from Page One)
In (the foyer was a dis­

play of the couple’s original 
wedding gifts and wedding 
pictures. A framed copy of 
the wedding license, signed 
by Tom Nolen, then county 
clerk, was also among the 
displays. Inside, a table 
held a display of greeting 

■cards from friends on the 
occasion of their fiftieth 
anniversary.

Guests were served from 
a huge golden wedding cake 
topped with a gold lettered 
“50th” at the bride’s table 
and from the bridegroom’s 

' table a chocolate cake.
The honored couple and 

the hosts and hostesses 
formed the receiving line. 
Nieces and nephews and 
brothers anid sisters of the 
couple composed the house 
pi-irty.

Piano music was provid­
ed during the reception 
hours by Mrs. Brock Jones, 
Mis. Boide Owens of Barn­
hart, Mrs. R. A. Harrell, 
and Miss Cheryl Schnee- 
mann of Big Lake.

Mrs. Schneemann, a na­
tive of Ozona, the daughtei’ 
of Mr. and Mrs. Phil Perner, 
and Mr. Sohneemann, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. William 
Schneemiann, and a native 
of Bellville, Texas, were 
married June 9, 1915, in 
the homie of the bride’s 
parents here in Ozona. The 
officiating minister was the 
late Rev. Nat B. Read, fa­
ther of Madden Read, Cro­
ckett county rancher, who 
was then pastor of the O- 
zena Methodisit Church.

Mr. Schneemann h a s  
been active in ranching on 
the same ranch north of 
Ozona since their marrage. 
They maintain a home in 
Ozona and on the ranch. 
In addition to his ranch­
ing interests, Mr. Sohnee­
mann is president of th e  
Big Lake State Bank. 

------------oOo------------
Miss Jeanie King of Ba­

ton Rouge, La., a classmate 
oif Miss Lucille Childress, 
'has been visiting with Lu­
cille and her family this 
week.

------------ oOo------------
Karen and Melody Rus­

sell are attending summer 
school at Ban Marcos Bap­
tist Academy this summer.

(Continued from Page One)
being given a chance t o ! 
vote on their likes or dis­
likes of the Supreme Court 
decision, but are being giv­
en d chance to vote on en- 

I larging the Senate by 8 
I members from 31 to 39,
! since such an increase was 
I needed if the proposed re- 
I districting bill is to be put 
I into effect. The vote will be 
i  to increase the size of the 
I Senate, to set the size of 
I the House at 150 members,
I and to delete the limitation 
I in the Constitution that 
provides that no county 
I may have more than one 
Senator.

The ultimate effect of 
the bill and the decision is 
to give the cities more votes 
and ito drastically reduce 
the voice of the rural areas 
of the state, a p o i n t on 
which voters a g a i n  will 
have no say.

------------ oOo------------
Father of Ozonan, 
George Haug, 82, 
Buried In Marlin

George Haug, 82, father 
of Mrs Arthur Kyle of O- 
zona, died Wednesday of 
lasit week at Marlin He had 
been in poor health for 
some time bUt death cdme 
unexpectedly from a hearth 
alttack.

Funeral services we r e  
held in Marlin Thursday 
with a number of Ozona 
friends of the family at­
tending Burial Was in Mar­
lin cemetery.

Mr. Haug is survived by 
two daughters, Mrs. Kyle of 
Ozona and Mrs. Catherine 
Cahal of Marlin. Three 
grandchildren, Arit, George 
and Kay Kyle, also survive. 

------------oOo------------
Mr. and Mrs. Allen Gann, 

formerly of Ozona and 
now of Brawley, California, 
■have been spending a few 
days in Ozona. visiting with 
friends.

You May Pay 
O ZO N A DRUG  

Accounts at 
Baker Jewelers

A

they’re shootin’ the works 
to put you in a bargain ’65!
The hot-as-a-pistol Dodge Boys are blasting their way to a 
third straight year of phenomenal sales! This means you’re 
in the saddle on a '65 Dodge Deal of a lifetime. These happy- 
go-lucky car-punchers can afford longer deals than ever 
before. They want to move their stock. So come to your 
nearest Dodge Boy spread and take the pick of the herd —  
sassy Darts, sleek Coronets, thundering Polaras . . .  wag­
ons, sedans, convertibles, you-name-its —  right now dur­
ing the Dodge Boys' SUCCESS DRIVE '65! -  ^ BOVS

JAMES MOTOR COMPANY
807 W . 11th St. O ZO N A, T E X A S

I'.'i'J ”  I  ..........

FOOD
STORE

BUD L O U D A M Y -Y O U R  INDEPENDENT GROCER  
SPECIALS — Thurs., p. m., Fri., &  Sat. June 10—11—12

HAMBURGER

MEAT
3 $1.00

FRESH U. S. D. A .

FRYERS
LB. 33c

BEEF (F A M IL Y  STYLE)

STEAK
LB. S9c

PORK (L E A N )

STEAK
LB. $9c
ALL M EAT

B o lo g n a
LB. 49c

LONGHORN RINDLESS

CHEESE
LB. 59c

CHICKEN OF THE SEA

TUNA 3 for $1
CH IQUITA BRAND

Bananas 10c
FRESH FIRM

AVOCADOS
2 for 25c

CALIFORNIA W H ITE

POTATOES 
10 LBS. 09c

~  M ARYLAN D  CLUB

COFFEE
79cPER

POUND

MIRACLE W HIP SALAD

DRESSING
QT. 59c
STO K ELY’S

PEACHES
NO. 2 1/2  
CAN 29c

GLADIOLA 25 LB. BAG

FLOUR
CHUCK W A G O N

Bar-B-Q Sauce
29c18 O Z. 

BOTTLE

v e r m I c e l l i
3 PKGs. 25c

S m T T -P A P E R

TOWELS
GIANT
ROLL 39c

REYNOLD’S W R AP

FOIL
25 FT. 
ROLL 35c

ZEE -  80 COUNT

NAPKINS
2 PKGs. 29c

c r is c o

79c3 LB.
CAN

STO K ELY’S -  PIE

CHERRIES

2 NO. 303Q O  A  
CANS V 9 V

STO K ELY’S -  Honey Pod

PEAS

2 NO. 3 0 3 ^ 1 1  A  
CANS

H U N T’S -  T O M A TO

CATSUP
14 OZ. 
BTL. 19c

K O U N T Y KIST

CORN
2 for 33c


