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isgruntled Citizens Asking Questions
¥ ¥ -

Wintry Weather Has Returned
Oklahoma Lane 
Has Wind Damage | ~
A white, silent world with 

minimum traffic greeted 
residents of Muleshoe and
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II

O.L. Jarmon Number 
One, being drilled approxi­
mately eight miles north 
and one mile east of Mule­
shoe is below 7,600 feet at 

’ this time.
The well operator is Con- 

vest Energy Corporation of 
Houston and driller is 
Sitton Oil of Lubbock. 

*****
Friday night, in action in 

Muleshoe, the Mulettes 
broke a longstanding dist­
rict game winning streak 
for the Dimmitt girls, and 
defeated them, 36-33. 
High pointer for Muleshoe 
was Cindy Hamblen, with 
18 points.
The Mules lost to the 

Dimmitt Bobcats by a 
score of 51-44, with'Mike 
Northcutt high scorer at 14 
points.

Friday morning, the 
second candidate filed for 
a place on the board of 
trustees for the Muleshoe 
Independent School Dist­
rict.

Incumbent Ronnie Holt 
filed for re-election for one 
of the two places to be 
filled. Incumbent R.D. 
(Tub) Angeley filed early 
last week for re-election. 

*****
Jim Hightower, candi­

date for Texas Railroad 
Commissioner will be in 
Muleshoe Tuesday, Feb­
ruary 12, at 4 p.m. in the 
Bailey County Courthouse.

Interested persons are 
encouraged to visit the 
candidate while he is in 
M uleshoe.

*****
Muleshoe Area Youth 

Activities Committee Inc. 
will meet at the Bailey 
County Exhibition Center 
and Coliseum at 6:30 p.m. 
on Monday, Feb. 11, to 
complete plans for the 
youth Valentine Dance 
scheduled for Thursday, 
February 14.

*••••
Among the students 

qualifying for the Dean’s 
honor roll at Texas Tech 
University for the fall 
semester were Toni B. 
Henry, Geazul Hernandez, 
Lary I Hooten, Elizabeth 
Isaac, Joel M. Nowlin, 
Judith B. Precure, Karen 
S. Stovall and Steve L. 
T urner.

*****
Keith Pate of Western 

Sprinklers in Muleshoe 
was recently honored by 
Lindsay Manufacturing 
Co. for his outstanding 
sales achievements during 
1979. Western Sprinklers 
was one of the se\en top

the surrounding area Sat­
urday morning, with up to 
four inches of white, fluffy 
snow falling before day­
light Saturday. Around 9 
a.m. Saturday, the snow 
was still falling, but the 
sun was making an 
attempt to peep through 
the clouds, with snow still 
fall yg.

No accidents had been 
reported in the area by 
presstime, and a look at 
the streets and highways 
and checking with the 
Bailey County Law En­
forcement Center showed 
the slick, snow and ice- 
packed streets and high­
ways reached a wide area.

All day on Friday, inter­
mittent snow was borne on 
a high wind, and no 
accumulation of snow was 
noted until late in the 
afternoon on Friday.
The storm that moved 

through the area Thursday 
night and Friday covered 
most of the state. Thun­
derstorms were reported 
Thursday evening, accom­
panied by booming thun­
der and brilliant lightning 
flashes.

Early Saturday morning, 
around 3:30 a.m., the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Stewart norhteast 
of Muleshoe was destroy-

Cont. on page 8 col 5

Baptist Church 

Slates Meeting 

During Week
A Llanos Altos Baptist 

A ssociational Evangelism 
Rally will be held with the 
First Baptist Church of 
Muleshoe on Monday, 
February 11. There will be 
an afternoon session of the 
rally beginning at 4:30 
p.m. and an evening ses­
sion at 7:30 p.m., accord­
ing to church officials.

Llanos Altos Baptist As­
sociation is composed of 34 
churches and missions in 
Bailey, Lamb, Parmer and 
Castro Counties. An at­
tendance goal of 300 mem­
bers from the respective 
churches of the Associa­
tion has been set for the 
meeting.

Guest personalities for 
the Evangelism Rally in­
clude Dr. Fred Wolfe, 
pastor of First Baptist 
Church, Lubbock; John 
Street, pastor of First Bap­
tist Church, Dimmitt; Dr. 
Strauss Atkinson. Director 
of Missions of Caprock- 
Plains Area; Randy An­
derson. Music Evangelist 
from Sapulpa, Okla.; and 
Buddy Wells, Church Ser­
vices Director of Caprock 
Plains Area.

"A cordial invitation is 
extended to everyone to 
attend, ”  added the pastor 
of the M uleshoe First Bap-

THE SNOW IS BEAUTIFUL, BUT— Mr. and Mrs. C.E. Fox, of 1709 West Avenue D 
are down to realities Saturday morning as they are both out with brooms attempting 
to clean more than four inches of snow from their driveway. Snowdrifts were up to 
one foot deep in some places in Muleshoe after being formed by moderate to heavy 
winds. ^

Criminal Jury Trials 
Begin On Monday

Thirteen cases are sche­
duled for trial in criminal 
court before District Judge 
Pat Boone, beginning 
Monday, tomorrow. Pre­
trials will get underway at 
10 a.m., with prospective 
jurors scheduled to report 
for service later in the 
week.

Case to be tried include 
Revecca Elaine Ilolladay, 
theft; burgla>y; James 
Randolph Dewbre and 
Rebecca Elaine Holladay, 
burglary; James Randolph 
Dewbre, burglary; San­
tiago Leal, theft; John L. 
Dillworth, theft; Guada­
lupe Gloria, DWI; Larry 
Don Vaughn, theft: Ruben 
Gloria. James Chavez,
Randy Jaramillo; Osualdo 
Barraz and Jesse Casan­
ova, Jr., theft; Larry 
Berry, theft; unauthorized 
operation of vehicle; Mon­
roe Hawkins, rape; Rich­
ard McDonald, Kenneth

Defensive Driving 
Course Is Offered 
To Area Residents

Muleshoe Home Exten­
sion Clubs Council will 
sponsor a Defensive Driv­
ing Course Monday and 
Tuesday nights, February 
11-12, from 6:30 - 10:30 
p.m. each night.

The course will be con­
ducted in the First Uniteu 
Methodist Church Fel­
lowship Hall and will cost 
S4 each person for the 
eight hour course.

Additional information 
may be obtained by calling 
the Extension Service Of­
fice at 272-4559.

Many insurance com­
panies will give a good 
percentage deduction on 
insurance rates forper»ons 
who have c'mpleted the 
defensive driving course,

McDonald, Ray Charles 
Thomas, theft and Larry 
Wright, Joyce Wright, 
theft.

Prospective jurors sche­
duled to appear for service 
at 9:30 a.m. on Tuesday,

Rotary Sees 
Stewardship 
Slide Show

“ Love of the land”  was 
the basic reason given for 
farmers staying with their 
avowed way of life, accord­
ing to Kirk Cunningham of 
Stauffer Chemical Co. He 
presented an outstanding 
slide showing to members 
of the Muleshoe Rotary 
Club Tuesday at noon.

Cunningham gave a 
background on the pur­
pose farm chemicals, her­
bicides, insecticides and 
fertilizers have played in 
improving efficiency of 
farming operations.

“ You have to sell your­
self before you can sell 
anything else,”  he told 
Rotarians.

“ Stewards of the Soil,”  
was the title of his slide 
presentation, which
spread in a panorama 
across three screens set up 
in the Rotary meeting 
room. It was explained by 
Harmon Elliott, who ob­
tained the program for the 
local Rotarians, that Cun­
ningham had been highly, 
praised after giving hts 
presentation to the Lub­
bock Rotary and other area 
Rotary clubs.

The guest explained that 
it tak.i a bare minimum of 
$100,000 to start farming 
today, and that much more 
education is required by a 
farmer before he can suc­
cessfully farm and provide 
food for the rest of the 
nation and much of the

February 12 include Er­
nestine Litte, Nona Mar­
low, Euleta Stockard, G.C. 
Biggerstaff, Loretta Lloyd, 
Louis Peacock, Melba 
King, C.C. Snitker, Guy 
Austin, Jo Harmon, 
Kathryn Kramer, Clara 
Lou Jones, Doris Vandiver 
and Richard Johnson.

Also Vera McKillip, 
James Richardson, Terry 
Sowder, Barbara F. Autry,
Ross N. Allen, Eddie W. 
Beene, Robert A. Berry, 
Allie D. Barbour, Douglas 
J. Betts, Bobby R. Burris, 
Jeryl M. Bellar, Robert F. 
Baker, Ronnie L. Black, 
Ralph G. Beasley, Arvin 
Nelson Brashear, Ben F. 
Chapman, Mrs. Connie 
Carpenter, J. Wayne Crit­
tenden, Janice L. Clay- 
brook, Jessie Ray Carter, 
Barbara F. Colley, Gloria 
C. Costorena, Mike S. 
Dale and Jack Dunham.

And, Gilbert W. Dale,
LaRedo R. Flores, Creston 
L. Faver, Clif C. Griffiths,
Cont. on Page 8 col 1

Milk Testing 

School Slated 
For Muleshoe

An Official Milk Testing 
School will be conducted 
by Michael M.
Tomoszewski of Texas 
A&M University in Mule­
shoe Friday and Saturday, 
February 15-16.

The hours will be from 
8-12 a.m. on Friday and 
I -4 p.m . on Saturday in the 
Muleshoe Area Library 
basement.

West Plains Dairy Goat 
Association is sponsoring 
the school fo all dairy goat 
breeders and operators 
and dairy cattle opera­
tions.

Cost of the school is 
57.50 per person. Addi­
tional information can be

Dalton Captured
At Shallowater; 
Returned Here

Twenty-six year old 
Michael Lee Dalton found 
short-lived freedom Wed­
nesday after successfully 
escaping from the Bailey 
County jail sometime Early 
Wednesday morning.

According to Bailey 
County Sheriff’s office 
personnel, Dalton had 
been checked on around 
midnight Tuesday, and 
shortly after 8 a.m. Wed­
nesday, it was found he 
had somehow pried open 
the door to his cell, where 
he had been isolated 
Tuesday, and had also 
pried off the security 
screen to exit through a 
window in the run-around 
area of the jail.

One official said Dalton 
had managed to cut him- 
self'Tuesday morning and 
was taken to West Plains 
Medical Center for
stitches, and was isolated 
in a cell when he was 
returned to the Bailey 
Cont. on page 8 col 4

DECA Plans 
Rock-A-Thon

To Get Funds
Muleshoe High School 

Distributive Education 
Club of America will join 
the South Plains Muscular 
Dystrophy Association to 
sponsor a 24-hour Rock-A- 
Thon on Friday, March 7.

Fundraising events for 
the MDA will be conduct­
ed prior to the Rock-A- 
Thon as participants are 
currently accepting pled­
ges for each hour they can 
rock in a rocking chair 
during the 24 hours. Spon­
sors are also encouraged to 
give a straight contribution 
if they do not wish to 
pledge by the hour for 
rockers.

Entertainment for parti­
cipants and spectators is 
being scheduled. For 8-11 
p.m. on Friday night, 
square dances and round 
dances wili be performed. 
The dancers are from the 
New Mexico District and 
the Texas Federation.

Saturday morning,
chapters of “ Undersea 
Kingdon,”  Will be shown, 
starring Roy ‘ Cash’ Corri­
gan and Smiley Burnette. 
(The movies is a sea "Star 
Wars”  type picture.

Muleshoe High School’ s 
Mighty ‘ M ’ Stage Band 
will be performing Satur­
day afternoon and other 
entertainment is planned.

DECA and MDA said 
they wuuld like to invite 
everyone to join the Rock- 
A-Thon as participants,

and/or spectators.
Prizes will be awarded 

:ol-

Controversy Rages 
On New FMHighway
Commissioners Accused 

Of Withholding Information
Apparently, plans for 

the construction of an 8.4 
mile FM road scheduled 
for construction one mile 
west of Bula, north to 

Circleback, have not been 
scrapped. In fact, it was 
announced at a public 
hearing in Muleshoe 
Wednesday, that plans are 
complete and preliminary 
work has started.

This was disclosed amid 
allegations of ‘withholding 
information and misinfor­
mation’ which was said to 
be the basis for a nearly 
five year ‘ mis-understand- 
ing.’

Bailey County Judge 
Glen Williams moderated 
the meeting, and started 
of* the meeting by intro­
ducing the personnel from 
the State Department of 
Highways and Public 
Transportation who atten­
ded the meeting to explain 
what has happened, and 
answer questions.

SDHPT personnel intro­
duced Included George 
Wall, district engineer; 
C.W. Nall, assistant dis­
trict engineer; James W. 
King, district administra­
tor; Jerry Bernethy, plan­
ner; Ray Bradley, Resident 
supervisor; Loyd Lust, 
senior designer; Dalton 
Jones, District designer 
engineer; Lloyd Killough, 
and Stanley Burreson of 
the Muleshoe office.

Judge Williams gave a 
brief explanation of the 
basic structure and inter­
nal process of the Farm 
Road Program, and a brief
history of the road now 
under construction.

Then, Judge Williams 
prefaced his next remarks 
by telling the more than 50 
people present, “ What I 
have to say now is delicate, 
unpleasant, and I will have

to say things I wish I did 
not have to say. My sole 
interest is to help you, help 
commissioner’ s court, and 
help the highway depart- 
m ent.

“ This is not a power 
struggle, it is not to 
determine whether or not 
to build a road. That is 
already determined, the 
road is not in Jeopardy. 
The fact is, commissioners 
court signed an agreement 
to pave 8.4 miles, one mile 
west of Bula and some 
work is already done.

“ You all live in that 
community and you all live 
in this county,”  he added.

Judge Williams explain­
ed that from November 16, 
1966, on a motion by Loyd 
Stephens and the late 
Commissioner R.P.
McCall, that portion of the 
county was given a
Number One priority, and 
included in a proposed 
paving program. The vote 
Cont. on page 8 Col 1

Valentine 
Disco Set 
For Youth

All area youth will be 
welcomed at the first 
annual Muleshoe Area 
Youth Activity Valentine 
Disco. It will be from 8-11 
p.m. on Thrusday, Feb­
ruary 14.

Providing special prizes 
will be the YAC and Bear 
Enterprises of Portales 
who will present the disco 
sounds.

Bring your sweetheart 
and attend the youth 
dance Thursday night. The 
cost of the dance is $2 for 
singles at S3 for couples.

Warren Announces 
For Commissioner

ekment
/op  ̂Gi

James Warren, a 
Bailey County resident for 
most of his life, has 
authorized The Journal to 
officially announce his 
candidacy for Bailey 
County Commissioner, 
Precinct Three, subject to 
the Re publican Primary in 
M ay.

He has been a farmer in 
the Longview community 
and formerly resided in the 
community before moving 
into Muleshoe several 
years ago. Currently, War­
ren is still farming, how­
ever, hi* son, RicHard, wTFT— 
br-hrting over the-fatmiivg— 
operations.

James Warren, and his 
wife, Fern, who is assis­
tant cashier at First 
National Bank, are also the 
parents of Japes Jr., who 
is a Trooper for the 
Department of Public 
Safety, and stationer} at 
Abernathy 
who resi

Warren has served on

President of the Muleshoe 
Co/op^ Gin Board. During 
World War II, he served 
with the U.S. Army 
Engineers and was in the 
Pacific Theater.

Of his candidacy, War­
ren commented, “ If elect­
ed, I will serve the people 
on a full time basis in an 
efficient and businesslike 
manner with the equip­
ment available.”

Pd. Pol Adv. By 
James Warren

thy; and Linda,
tides in 1

1
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HICKORY SMOKED SLICEDHEAVY GRAIN FED BEEF

SLAB
BACONROUND

STEAK
&TERCUT

Q T P A I ^  HEAVYGRAir 
W  I  C # m l \  CENTER CUT

T - B O N E ^ '
C T C  A  \M  HEAVY GRAIN 
0  I  E H  I V  TOP ROUND

C T P A  I f  HEAVY GRAIN 
0  I  E H I \  BONELESSBC

CUTLETS BEEH

U  A  | U |  OSCAR MAYER 
n ^ l ¥ l  CHOPPED...............

M  A  f k / I  OSCAR MAYER
SLICED COOKED..

HOT LINKS

HAPPY ™ 
VALENTINES g

DAY! ATS
WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 

PRICES EFFECTIVE FEBRUARY 10-16,1900

ASSTD.-DECORATOR 
SCOTT PAPER

GLOVERS 
MEXICAN STYLE

TOWELS
CATSUP tf.w.Jiv:

MARYLAND CLUB 
ALL GRINDS

LUCKY LEAF 
CHERRY PIE

J TAMALES
*  M a y o n n a i s e ;

*  CHILI BBT.....
$ MAXI PADS 
5 MEOW MIX

12CT.
BOX

NEW
FREEDOM

(arnation

ORANGE JUICE 
CHEESEgasassssi"
PARKAY SQUEEZE .................

B u t t e r m i l k s ;

CREAM h a l PI^h a lf

ICE CREAM

I  I U I I  I  I f  CARNATION INSTANT 
1 I V I  I L I X  NON-FAT DRY

1 CREAMER 
-  COCOA MIXs 3 BREAKFAST

MINUTE 
MAIO . .

20 QT 
BOX

VASELINE INT. CARE REG OR

£  HERBAL  
■  LO TIO N

FOR MORE INFORMATION SEE DISPLAY IN YOUR STORE

VASELINE INTENSIVE CARE

BATH
BEADSCALIFORNIA ICEBERG

COME TO MY SAY 
101 YOUIWI C 

CARD PURCHASES
OPEN 8:00
Monday

9:00

SATURDAY
VASELINE

^ P e t r o l e u m
■ j e l l y  ’«

SUNDAY- "9:00-8:00

COTTON

I Q -T IP S  
*1 SW A B S 170 CT 

BOX

* ONIONS
* ONIONS
* ORANGES

BUNCHES
CUTEX REG./LEMON

PO LISH
R e m cCALIFORNIA 

SUNKIST NAVEL

ARMOUR

TREET
IMEAT

■RWITH BEANS
N o r m ® 1

\ChiJl/

Q U A L IT Y
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The invitation for SPC to 
provide the fashion seg­
ment of the festivities 
came from John Anderson, 
executive director of the 
Food and Fiber National 
Institute of Achievement.

part-time instructor in the 
country/bluegrass pro­
gram, Don Weemes, stu­
dent, and Don Hanson, 
music instructor, perform­
ed background music dur­
ing the style show.

hometowns as follows: 
Abernathy; Jonea Bray, 
Anton; Margaret Romirez, 
Levelland; Eva Rios, 
Lockney; Connie Rodri­
quez, Loranzo; Renee 
Biggs, Lubbock; Sherrie 
Brown and Terri Black- 
well, Morton; Darlene 
Stevens, Muleshoe; Anna 
Hernandez, Ropes; Sharon 
Dalton, Tulia; Terri Dunn.

An SPC -• Lynn Daniel,

LEVELLAND. TEXAS «  
For the firs time in their 
history, models from the
South Plains College fash­
ion merchandising pro­
gram, put on a style show 
in the Lubbock Memorial 
Civic Center.

The fashion show fea­
turing wool and mohair, 
was held at 8 p.m. 
February 7, in the Civic 
Center's Banquet Hall.

The show concluded an 
evening’s slate of activities 
sponsored by the Food and 
Fiber National Institute of 
Achievement, Inc.

“ This is a really good 
opportunity for our
students,’ ’ said Cindy 
Brown, assistant professor 
of fashion merchandising 
at SPC.

“ I think they will benefit 
a great deal from the 
experience. Texas Tech, 
did the fashion show last 
year.”

Activities included the 
dedication of the
Sheep/Goat--W ool/M o- 
hair Exhibit and Hall of 
Achievement at 5 p.m. 
that day in the Food and 
Fiber Gallery at the 
Museum of Texas Tech 
University. The late Fred 
Earwood, was honored ar 
a man who devoted much 
of his life to betterment of 
the sheep and goat
industry.

A “ Taste of Texas" 
dinner at 7:30 p.m. in the 
Civic Center's Banquet 
Hall featured foods grown 
in Texas and the style 
show.

A dozen SPC students 
modeled designer fashions 
from Debby Donnell of San 
Angelo, clothing from

Tulia, Patti Pior of Lub­
bock, and Roxanne 
Mclnroe of Levelland. 
Both Madrid and Mclnroe 
arc serving as SPC’s co­
fashion representatives.

Cydney Farrar, SPC 
guidance associate in the 
Career Center, assisted 
with disco routines.

Hemphill Wells, Malouf’ s 
and Don’ s Limited, all of 
Lubbock.

Tammy Green Shirley of 
Smyer, former SPC fash­
ion representative, was the 
commentator, and tailored 
classics used in investment 
dressing.

Six disco dancers did 
routines featuring the 50s 
and classic investment 
dressing. They are Joann 
Madrid of Clovis, N.M., 
Nancy Herrin of Anton, 
Ronette Kitchens of Floy- 
dada, Sammie Choate of

WE’D LIKE TO SHOW YOU 
THE OLYMPIA OMEGA 303 
DRY COPYING SYSTEM

Models are listed by • SIMPLICITY
• DEPENDABILITY
• CLEAN, USEABLE 

COPIES. WHEN 
YOU NEED THEM! Williams Bros.

OFFICE SUPPLY 
Muleshoe_____ Texas

321 MAIN  

MULESHOE 

OPEN 9 TO 6

MULbSHOE COED...Anna Hernandez of Muleshoe
was one of the dozen South Plains College models, 
hosting a wool and mohair style show at 8 p.m. 
February 7, in the Lubbock Memorial Civic Center. The 
show vas during a “ Taste of Texas”  banquet, 
featuring foods grown here in the state. Anna, 19 year 
old daughter, of Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hernandez of 
Muleshoe, is a SPC fashion merchandising major. SPC

Let Us Do Your Spraying 
Ron Kidd

Custom Application

Tre flan-A trazine 
Milogard &Other 

Chemicals
We Are Now Taking orders 

on Bo-Bar Rope wick 
Applicators

Contact: Ron Kidd
Day: 965-2374 Night:272-3705

STOCKTON

Blouses

and

Pants

Total glamour is yours in this printed 
float. 100% nylon with assorted bold 
floral print. Many lovely colors and one 
size fits all.

The difference between 
center pivots is 

how many times 
they can do

ENTIRE STOCK

PLAYTEX BRAS 
& GIRDLES

Printed polyester interlock blouse is 
just a Perfect Match for these 100% 
stretch polyester gobardine pants. Sizes 
8-18 in oil the new Spring colors to 
match perfectly.Regular Price

Short Lengths

VELOUR SOLIDS

I  TO ,UJ W
•  New Shipment •  MO yd Lengths

$ 4 9 9  To $ 1 2 "

MENS DRESS SHIRT

AMERICAN 
T0URIST0R AND 

SAMSON! ft LUGGAGE

"NEW STYLES AVAILABLE A soft 6 5 %  p o lyes ter  
35%  cotton with shorten­
ed collar shirt. An excel­
lent choice for slacks or 
jeans. Sizes 14 V2 -17.

Valley builds them tougher.
It isn't just one thing.

It's the toughest gearbox in the industry —  the one they 
put on other make center pivots by the thousands when their 
gearboxes fail.

It's a new, no-grease urethane U-joint that easily outlasts 
conventional U-joints.

It’s a proven three-direction flex joint guaranteed on 
grades of up to 30%.

It's a structure where you can see the difference when 
you put a ruler to it.

And that’s just for starters Let us show you the rest

Haggar

Expand-O-Matic
Slacks

Snug Sock — Winter never felt so 
worm! This winter os you turn 
down your rhcrmostot to conserve 
energy coiv up in the fobulous / 
Snug Sockf it will keep you f t  
worm ond eomforfoble no mot- 
ter how low the temperature Lq j , 
foils n m

Combine sm ash ing  
good looks with com­
fo r ta b le  f i t  O ur 
answer is HaggarX 
E x p a n d -O -M a t  i c® 
slocks of 100%  To­
day’s Dacron® Poly­
ester. Colors Navy, 
Brown, C ornel ond  
Grey. Sizes 32-42

Valley dominates the field.

Valley
New Valley Lease

10% Down 

8.82% Interest Rate

Expires Feb. 22, 1980

Singleton-EUifc Funeral Home 
24 Hour Ambulance Service 
1. 272-4574  Muleafioe
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“Make And Take ” Workshop mal‘ine m“'
erials to take home.

Refreshments were ser­
ved at the end of the pro­
gram by Mrs. Janie Bald 
eras and Mrs. AnnOvler

BOYS IN GYNM ASTICS...The boys class of the Tri-County Gymnastics class received several honors at the meet 
in Lubbock, L to R. Botton Row; Danny Barrett, Jeff Johnson, Jeff Far, Zack Farr, Darly McCamish, and Scott 
Terrell. Second Row; Michael Barrett, Kevin Peterson, Michael Precure, Blake Lacewell, Darren Albertson, Matt 
Sowder, Top Row; L to R. Frank Precure, Wade King, Sammy Sayago, Grant Barnhill, and Todd Lowe.

Approximately 50 par­
ents of first grade child­
ren, attended the “ Make 
and Take”  Workshop, on 
Thursday evening at 
the Richland Hills Cafe­
teria.

While the small child­
ren, were taken care of by 
five girls, from the Mule- 
shoe Chapter ofF.H.A., 
their parents were busy 
making instructional mat­
erials, under the supervi­
sion of seven first grade 
teachers.

Milton Oyler, principal 
of Richland Hills Primary 
School, welcomed the par­
ents and expressed the 
hope, that the school and 
parents could continue 
working together, for the 
benefit of the children.

Mrs. Elizabeth Watson, 
Director of Instructional 
Prgrams for the Muleshoe 
Schools, then spent a few 
minutes explaining the 
purpose of the workshop-

Helping parents become

Tri-County Gymnastic Meet

actively involved in mak­
ing materials, to instruct 
children at home as rein­
forcement for what they 
are doing in school.

The remainder of the 
workshop was spent by

rjahitie SQides Shorn 
M a  jUuWtali

The Progress Club, met 
at the home of Ada 
Thompson, Tuesday, Feb­
ruary 5.

Ada Murrah showed 
slides of the trip she made 
to Tahitie. She also 
showed things she had 
bought and brought back 
from Tahitie.

Helen Redwine drew the 
hostess gift, Attending 
were: Furn Davis, Vita 
Self, Lucille Gross, Curtie 
Kirk, Elzada Gulley, 
Hellen Redwine, Alice 
Moore, Kaly Smith, 
Myrtle Chambless.

The next meeting will be 
February 19.

"In God We Trust" did 
not become the official 
motto  of  the United 
S ta te s  u n t i l  1956.

Out of^rbit

S P A C E
research

Students from Tri- 
County Gymnastic, Inc. 
attended a novice meet, 
February 2, hosted by 
Hamilton Gym in Lubbock. 
Coaches Karen Cleveland 
and Wayne Downing ac­
companied the students.

The following students 
attended the meet from 
the Tri-County area. Leslie 
Jones, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Dean Jones, 
Jamie White, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jay Carl 
White, both of Earth. Staci 
and Todd Lowe daughter 
and son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Lowe, Carrie Kindle, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
James Kindle all of Maple.

Blake Lacewell, son of 
Mr. and' Mrs. Tommy 
Lacewell, of Sudan; Three 
Way students are. Stacy 
Kindle, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bobby Kindle, 
Jarred and Matt Sowder 
sons of Mr. and Mrs. 
Mickey Sowder.

daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth McGehee, of 
Lazbuddie.

Students from Muleshoe 
were: Shonda Strahan, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gary Strahan, Darryl 
McCamish, son of Mr. and
Mrs. Clark McCamish, 
Darren Albertson, son of 
Dr. and Mrs. Gary Albert­
son, Jeff Johnson, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Larry John­
son, Jeff and Zack Farr, 
sons of Mr. and Mrs. Phil 
Farr.

Also, Sammy and
Marisa Sayago, son and 
daughter of Dr. and Mrs. 
Francisco Sayago, Grant 
Barnhill, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ted Barnhill, Kevin 
and Denese Peterson, son 
and daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs* WAync f  e,Urs«i.

Also, Danny, Michael 
and Latre'ce Barrett, sons 
and daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ricky Barrett,
Michael and Frank Pre-

Ray Precure, Wade King, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
King, Debbie Hicks, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jerry Hicks, Debbie Isaac, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Isaac

Also, Jana and Debbie 
Brown, daughters of Mr. 
and Mrs. James L. Brown, 
Vana Pruitt, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerrell 
Pruitt.

Penny and Rhea Klesel, 
daughters of Mr. and Mrs. 
Glen Klesel, Tamara and 
Amy Bean, daughters of 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Bean 
all of the Needmore area.

The categories of com­
petition were pommel 
horse, vault, parallel bars, 
balance beam, exercise, 
tumbling and all-around 
awards.

m
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Amy McGehee, cure, sons of Mr and

Announcing....

Sandra Davidson
Will be in the Main 

Street Beauty Salon 
February 14-15 
To Create Your own 
Individual Look with 
Private Consultation.

Natural Woman Proffessional Makeup 
Artist&Skin Specialist, Your Personalized 
Appointment Will Include Scientific Skin 
Analysis, Deep Skin Cleansing Treatment, 
Valuation O f facial Structure &Features

proffessional Makeup Application 
^ & Recommended Techniques 

For Your Appointment Call:

Main Street Beauty- 
Salon115 Main 272-3448

fffuifen'ts receive?!
awards in the competition 
as follows: Leslie Jones- 
sixth in vault, Shelly Ter­
rell - sixth in bars, Stacy 
Kindle - fourth in vault, 
Shonda Strahan- fifth in 
vault, sixth in bars, sixth 
in tumbling, sixth beam, 
fourth all-around; Sammy 
Sayago - first bars, first 
vault, first pommel horse, 
third tumbling; Darren 
Albertson - fifth pommel 
horse, fourth bars, fourth 
vault, third tumbling; 
Blake Lacewell - sixth 
vault, fifth tumbling; Jeff 
johnson - fifth tumbling; 
Jeff Farr - sixth bars, sixth 
tumbling; Grant Barnhill- 
fourth tumbling; Kevin 
Peterson, fifth bans,
second tumbling, sixth 
vault.

Also, Michael Barrett- 
fith vault, third tumbling, 
sixth bars; Michael Pre­
cure- first iumbling, first 
vault, fifth bars; Wade 
King - second bars, third 
tumbling, fifth vault; 
Frank Precure- sixth bars, 
first tumbling, second 
vault, sixth pommell 
horse, Todd Lowe - fifth 
tumbling; Scott Terrell - 
second tumbling, third 
vault.

Also Matt Sowder - first 
tumbling, second pommell 
horse, third bars, sixth

TRI-COUNTY GYMNASTIC M EET.. .Students of the Tri-County Gymnastic class 
earned several ribbons at the meet in Lubbock. L ro R Shonda Strahan, Jami White 
Sbelli Terrell, Leslie Jones, Stacy Kindle, Amy McGehee, and Stacy Lowe.

Final Reduction 
Sale

Now In Progress!
Merchandise

50%
&

7 5 %  OFF

LATRELL’S FASHIONS
PHONE 806 272 3459 1519 WEST AMERICAN BIVD 

MULESHOE,„TEXAS 79347

VALENTINE
G IF T S

vault; Jarrod Sowder -
second bars, fourth tum­
bling, fourth pommel 
horse, fifth vault; Latrece 
Barrett - second bars, first 
tumbling, third floor exer­
cise, second balance
beam, third vault, second 
all-around. 
more to come

Also Debbie Hicks- fifth 
bars, Denese Peterson - 
first bats, first vault, first 
all-around, second tumbl­
ing, second floor exercise, 
third balance beam; Deb­
bie Brown - fourth balance 
beam, fourth all-around, 
fifth bars, third floor exer­
cise, fourth vault, first 
tumbling, first all-around.

Marisa Sayago - fifth 
tumbling, third bars, se­
cond floor exercies, seond 
vault, sixth floor exercise, 
sixth tumbling, sixth all- 
around; Debbie Isaac - 
fifth bars; Rhea Klesel - 
first floor exercise, third 
tumbling, fourth vault, 
fourth bars, fourth balance 
beam, fourth all-around.

Tamara Bean- sixth floor 
exercise; Amy Bean - se­
cond tumbling; Vana 
Pruitt - third vault, fifth 
floor exercise, sixth bal­
ance beam, fourth bars, 
sixth all-around.

GIFT:
DISCOUNT CENTERS

Store Hours: 
Mon-Sot. 9-7 

Sun.1-6 Feb. 10-13

Valentine

Hearts Candy
Reg.!5”  ^ 3 ^

$ 6 9 9

$J49

5-Pc Bath Sets
$799

Valentine

Cards
2 / 9 0 « f |

RE961-71 2 /$l 15
Reg. W Thru *1“ 7 9 *

Caress

Family She

Tide

Bath Soap
x\ 4.75 m .

S IP  Foaming Engine

Degreaser
$159

Rubbermaid Vanity

Wastebaskets

’ll $| 79

Waring Multi-Speed

Handntixer 
$ 9 9 9

Johnson's

Baby Oil
10 FI ox.

Ivory
Oiswashing Liquid

9 9 <

22 FI. ox.

Crest 
Toothpaste

e v e r y  d a y
r  . LOW PRICES 

Homo Milk ij05
1/2 Gal. Homo Milk 96*
Gal. Lowfat MHk * Z j l "  
1/2 Gal. Lowfat........94$
1/2 Gal. Buttermilk...W

2  Lb. Cottage Choose 
1 Lb. Cottage Cheese 
Sour Cream

41
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The American Associa­

tion of University Women, 
has selected Frantonya 
Berryhill, February girl, of 
the month. This honor is 
based on her school, 
church and community ac­
tivities,

Frantonya is the 18 year 
olf daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Gil Lamb and a 
senior at Muleshoe High 
School,

She won second in the 
Texas State Extemporan­
eous Speaking Contest, in 
1978, and was the Texas 
State Champion in the 
event in 1979.

This year she is a state 
qualifier in the Texas For­
ensic Association and will 
compete in this contest 
held in Arlington in 
M arch

She has been extempor­
aneous captain and pre­
sident of the Speech Club, 
was twirler for the Might 
M Band, for two years, 
and is presently serving as 
HECE Vice-President.

Fran is an active mem­
ber of the First United 
Methodist Church and is 
president of the United 
Methodist Youth. She is 
presently serving as
sweetheart of the Kiwanis.

Fran is looking forward 
to college, where she 
wants to major in Mass 
Communication.

Congratulations to
Frantonia for her achieve­
ments and for her selection 
as Girl of the Month.

I TOPS Ha* |
\W eekly Meeting j

B ~ " *
Clara Lou Jones, presi­

dent, called the TOPS Club 
meeting to order,'“ Thurs- 
day, February 7 at 6:30 
p.m. The TOPS song was 
sung, and pledge recited.

Evelen Harris, called 
the roll, with 24 members 
weighing in.

Receiving material for 
three weeks weight loss 
were: Ellauese Norman
and Zeffa Shafer.

Best loser for the week 
was Lola Goodrich, first 
runner up was Vickie Gar­
ner, with Aurara Mata and 
Levell Parker as second.

Vickie Garner was best 
loser for the month, Lola 
Goodrich; first runner up 
and Brenda Murphy; 
second.

Nan Gatlin was named 
KOPS monthly queen.

The meeting was dis­
missed with the goodnight 
song.

"A friend is, as it were, a 
second self." Cicero

% r

20% < f

TOWLE  
STAINLESS

•

NOW
FOR
TWO WPEKS ONLY .

m

you mav p t'ih tw  Vpiece place sellings and hostess vets of both Towle and 
Supreme stainless flatware at 20% off the regular price. All ten of these lovely 
patterns are made of 19/8 stainless steel, the finest quality stainless available for 
flatware Don’t miss this excer*ional opportunity to purcm.se fine quality 
stainless at 20% savings This is a limited time offer so hurry in tcxlay and choose 
one of these ten handsome patterns on sale.

X I Omicron X I 
Beta Sigma Phi

Xi Omicron Xi of Beta There was a 8reat deal of

f r a n t o n y a  b e r r y h i l l  
Moonlight 
Extension 
Service Club

The Moonlight Exten­
sion Service Club, met 
Tuesday night, Feb. 5 in 
the 16 and Ave. D. Church 
of Christ, friendship room.

President, Trudy
Derrick, brought the meet- 
ting to order with the roll 
call. Jessie Robinson read 
the minutes from the last 
meeting and Linda Huck- 
aby gave a report from 
council-reminding the 
members about the
defensive driving course to 
be held February 11 and 
13, from 6:30 until 10:30 
p.m., at the Methodist 
Church, Fellowship Hall.

The Moonlight members 
discussed projects to be 
carried out in the near 
future, including a home 
interior program, an exer­
cise program and a micro- 
wave demonstration.

The program for the 
night was given by Betty 
Campbell, on poison pre­
vention. Betty gave the 
members a test to find out 
how to poison proof their 
homes and a quiz on their 
knowledge of different 

1 poisons.
The club then adjourned 

with the reminder that 
there will be a Home 
Interior program for the 

” next meeting, February 
19, in the 16 and Ave. D 
Church of Christ Friend­
ship Room.

Moraw
Receivers
Plaque

Charles Moraw, receiv­
ed a plaque, Thursday 
that proclaims he is a 
“ Man with 40,000 Sweet­
hearts” .

He received the Zeus 
award, from E.S.A. Inter­
national, through the local 
chapter of Epsilon Chi. He 
was chosen for this recog­
nition, for his hard work 
and the support he gave 
the Epsilon Chi during the 
year of 1978-79

Secrets
A secret is something 

which you find out by 
reading the gossip 
columns.
-Democrat, Paducah, Ky.

Sigma Phi met in the home 
of Mrs. Dave M arr on 
Tuesday night, February 
5, at 8:00 o'clock with M rs. 
Skip Magby serving as 
co-hostess.

Mrs. Don Harmon pre­
sented the program on 
Russia. She and her hus­
band, Don, visited Russia 
on a people to people good 
will tour. Mrs. Harmon 
explained that one of the 
main objectives of this tour 
was to try and create good 
will on a one-to-one basis.

Mrs. Harmon showed 
slides and told of some of 
the experiences that they 
had while on this trip. 
Some of the interesting 
things were: Their group 
was assigned an in-tourist 
•guide by the Russian 
government even though 
they had a tour guilde. 
This guide worked for the 
government and was not 
allowed to visit with the 
tourist for any length of 
time on a personal basis. 
Also, the tourist were not 
given a choice of which 
hotel they would stay in 
while in Russia but were 
assigned various hotels by 
the government as they 
entered a particular city.
It was also evident, said 
Mrs. Harmon that the 
Russian government was 
deep in preparation for the 
coming Summer Olympics.

construction and renova­
tion going on for this 
coming event. Another in­
teresting occurence, from 
the American view point 
was the wedding cere­
monies. The government 
assigns a couple that they 
decide to marry, a day to 
have their wedding. The 
government gives the 
couple one day off for the 
wedding. There are no 
church ceremonies and 
they hold their receptions 
in the locak parks.

After the program. Pre­
sident, Mrs. Bob Finney 
called the meeting to 
order. Mrs. Ken Box read 
the minutes of the last 
meeting and Mrs. Tom 
Merritt gave the
treasurer’ s report.

Committee reports were 
given and it was reported 
that preparations are still 
in progress for the Valen­
tine Ball which will be held 
on February 16, from 8:00 
to 12:00 p.m. at the Mule- 
shoe County Club.

Under new business, it 
was decided to send in a 
nomination for the Texas 
Panhandle Distinguished 
Service Award which is 
presented by West Texas 
State University. This 
award is for a woman that 
is distinguished in the area 
bf education, medicine, 
business, civil service, or

“ MAN WITH 40,000 SWEETHEARTS” ...Charles 
Moraw a "man with 40,000 Sweethearts”  says E.S.A. 
Women International. The award was presented by, 
Deborah St. Clair, Epsilon Chi president.

The human heart beats constantly at a rate of 60 to 80 
times a minute.

other professional areas. 
The nominees will be 
honored at a luncheon on 
April 19, 1980.

The nexi meeting will be 
on February 19, in the 
home of Mrs. Mike Miller 
with Mrs. Kearney Scog- 
gin serving as co-hostess. 
Mrs. Dave Marr and Mrs. 
Gary Shipman will be re­
sponsible for the program 
on South America.

Refreshments of cheese 
balls, crackers, chips, 
dips, condiments and cake 
were served to the follow­
ing members: Mrs. Steve 
Black, Mrs. Ken Box, Mrs. 
Tommy Black, Mrs. Bob 
Finney, Mrs. Tom Little, 
Mrs. Skip Magby, Mrs. 
Dave Marr, Mrs. Tom 
Merritt, Mrs. Alex
Schuster, Mrs. Kearney 
Scoggin, and Mrs. Gary 
Toombs.

Brownies
Brownie Troop #247, 

met Tuesday afternoon in 
the Girl Scout Hut. 
Brownie leaders, Cherry 
Estep and Glenda Copley 
brought the meeting to 
order, with the pledge of 
allegiance and the brownie 
prom ise.

The girls then passed 
the brownine dues can 
around singing the dues 
song. The brownies an­
swered the roll call by 
placing a valentine sticker 
on a cupid attendance 
poster.

Plans were made to 
attend brownie day at 
Lubbock, on March 8, and 
the brownies finished 
making their list of 
emergency phone num­
bers.

Refreshments of heart 
candy and punch were 
served to the girls and they 
adjourned their meeting 
by forming the magic 
brownie ring.

Members attending 
were LaTavia Copley, 
Lillie Garza, Lisa Cole­
man, Brandi Estep, Mar­
cia Blackwell and Beth 
Johnson.

The brownies will meet 
again February 12 when 
they will have their valen­
tine party.

cFo/t r jk )  9 rfapfHj
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Delta Kappa Gamma Meets In Sudan
The Epsilon Delta 

Chapter of Delta Kappa 
Gamma met Saturday, 
February 2, in Sudan.

Sudan members were 
hostesses for a 10:00 
o'clock Brunch in the 
Homemaking Cottage.

Mrs. Ronnie Smith, pre­
sident, welcomed the 
members and presided 
during the business ses­
sion. Chairmen from the 
five towns represented, 
reported concerning plans 
for honoring Future
Teachers and Retired 
Teachers in the area.

Mrs. Loretta Reid, fist 
vice-president, introduced 
the program "Future of 
Child Rearing and Its Ef­
fect Upon Education” , All 
the members participated 
in the program by telling 
family academic back­
ground and experiences 
related to expectations of 
parents, teachers and

others relative to achieve­
ment in school.

Miss Virginia Bowers 
led the group in singing 
Delta Kappa Gamma 
songs.

Muleshoe members at­
tending were: Mrs. Carrie 
Lee Bishop, Miss Virginia 
Bowers, Mrs. Joe Costen, 
Mrs. Jack Obenhaus, Mrs.

Oscar Rudd. 
Smith, and 
W atson.

Mrs. Eric 
Mrs. John

The enamel on your teeth 
is the hardest tissue in the 
bodv.

SMILES
It All Depends

Private (reading-What’s 
a Chinese urn?

Post Librarian-That de­
pends on how long he works.

Baconian Logic
Two men who had been 

bachelor cronies met.
“ Tell me. Tom,”  said 

one. “ did you marry that 
girl, or do you still get your 
own breakfast?"

"Yes," replied Tom.

Sonic Presents....
Tuesday Night Family Special

For Only

0 0
Pieces Of

Fried Chicken, Fries, 
Texas Toast, Salad &
1 Liter Pepsi.

Tuesday ONLY
6-9 p.m.

Call Ahead and Well 
Have It Ready For You.

272-3998

Bating

HAMBURG^
ONION RINGS

Final
Reductions

Starts
Monday, Febrary 11

Men’s Sport 
Coats & Suits

val.to*100 »3 2 #o

val.to*110 * 4 2 ° °

val.to*145 * 5 0 ° °

val.to*180 * 7 5 ° °

val.to *190 * 8 0 ® °

Men’8 Sport 
& Dress Shirts

Special Croups

One Group 
Vi Price

Dress Slacks
One Group-^ price

val. to

•27“ -»28 * i 0 ° °

•29-*30 « 1 0 «o

•32-*35 » 1 2 « o

Special Group * 8 ° °

Leather Coats
Broken Sizes Reduced To 

Clear!

One Group V6 ’ Price

Men’s Sweaters
Reduced to Clear

Priced From

* 5 00- , 2 0 #0

Men’s Fashion 
Jeans

•14-'16 * 5 ° °

•17-*21 * 7 ° °

•22-’27 * 9 ° °

Special Group
Tapered Leg 

Reg. *24

Minimum Charge For Alterations

Albertsons Shop For Men
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GYMNASTIC MEET...The Tri-County Gymnastics group attended a meet in Lubbock, February 2. 
Pictured L to R, Botton Row, Debbie Brown, Jana Brown, Marissa Sayago, Penny Klesel. Top Row, L to R. 
Rhea Klesel, Denese Peterson, Debbie Isaac, Latrcce Barrett and Debbie Hicks.

f Hobby Clw
The Muleshoe Hobby 

Club met in regular ses­
sion Thursday. Fifteen

Latest
Arrivals

BOY SCOUT WEEK...Mayor, Charles Bratcher signed 
a proclimation, proclaiming February 3-9 as Boy Scout 
Week. Pictured L-R. are Kevin King, Mayor Charles 
Bratcher, Chad Garlington and Jeff Farr.

Associates Portales 
Childrens Home

The Muleshoe Associat­
es of the Portales Christian 
Childrens Home, met at 
the home of Modine El­
more, with seven members 
and a visitor Docie King, 
of Slaton.

Members other than the 
hostess present were: 
Vickie Hendricks, Ethel 
Julien, Florine Mills, 
Oneida Cornelsion, Mable 
Caldwell and Ruth Wil­
liams. Ten owl memo pads 
were made to sell.

Refreshments of sand­
wiches, pigs in blankets, 
chips, cake, pie coffee and 
cold drinks were served.

The next regular meet-

f 7h iu V a jlu £\

ing will be in the home of 
Florine Mills, on Monday- 
February 19.

Why?
Why be logical and 

reasonable, when it is a 
great deal easier and ever 
so much more fun to be 
emotional and pre­
judiced?

-Journal, Atlanta.

Trrence Lee Miller
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 

R. Miller, are the proud 
parents of a new son, born 
January 30, at 8:05 p.m.

The young man weighed 
6 lbs, 6 ozs. and has been 
named Trrence Lee, he is 
the couple's first child.

Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. John P. Neill and 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn E. 
M iller, all of Lincoln, Neb.

Great grandmother' is 
Mrs. N.S. Sage of Idaho 
Falls, Idaho.

Too Nice
He (at movies)--Can you 

see all right?
She--Yes.
He--Is there a draft on

you?
She-No.
He-Seat comfortable?
She-Ycs.
He - Mind changing

places?

members were present, 
with vice-president. May 
Loyd in charge.

Articles on display were 
knitted shell-owl plaque; 
two seed paintings; bead 
and safety pin baskets; 
needle point box; milk 
glass vase; crocheted 
afghan; velvet valentine; 
soap soche; pillow cases; 
friggies, crocheted hat; pill 
box necklaces; beer
goblet; and winter scene 
picture.

Those attending were: 
Ethel Julian, Ola Epperly, 
Ruth Williams, Vickey 
Hendricks, Fiddle Shafer, 
LeVina Pitts, Myrtle 
Chambles, Veta Self, Opal 
Robinson, Jo Wilson, May 
Loyd. Dora Phipps,
Sammie Ethridge and 
Bernice Amerson.

Some historians believe that 
the modern western 
alphabet, the Hebrew al­
phabet, the Arabic alphabet 
and the Devanagari, an 
alphabet used in India, 
are all based ultimately 
on signs of the Egyptian 
hieroglyphic writing.
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VHILE 
SUPPLIES 

LAST

SELF-CLOSING
WASTEBASKET
Compact container for 
trash or laundry. Lid 
swings open & shut. In 
chocolate or gold 11V4x 
15x24'/, in 2864

Quantities Limited

LINGERIE
GIFTS*

“ To My King

for the man in your life 
from Jockey

by
Linda Mullin

County 
Extension Agent

Your body Talks for you
Is your body saying what 

you want it to --- even 
when you’ re not talking? 
You can’ t “ not”  commun­
icate. Even when you're 
not saying a word, you\e 
still communicating.
Without uttering a word, 
our bodies do the talking 
for us. So, even though 
you’ re sitting quietly at the 
dinner table not speaking a 
solitary word, you are 
sending messages to those 
around you.

About 70 percent of 
human communication is 
non-verbal, researchers 
say.. In addition, non­
verbal com m unication--the 
body--generally tells the 
truth. Problems arise, 
however, when we aren’ t 
aware of what our bodies 
are telling others--and 
when others don’ t under­
stand the message.

Most of us have little 
training in non-verbal 
communication. We learn 
what we do know by 
watching others and then 
imitating them.

Many people have 
learned inappropriate non­
verbal communication sig­
nals, so they send
messages they don’ t mean 
to send.

Here’ s an example:
some of us have learned to 
look serious--or even frown 
slightly--and cross our 
arms in front of ourselves 
when we're listening to a 
new acquaintance Speak. 
We've learned to do this, 
thinking this will impress 
the speaker with our 
seriousness. Instead, we 
impress him with negative 
feedback, of course. He 
may feel that his is not a 
good speaker, or that he 
frustrated us or bored us. 
To combat this problem, 
we must first realize that 
non-verbal communication 
exists, and then we can 
look at it with a more 
honest and healthy
approach. Finally, we can 
be aware of how our bodies 
are “ talking for us”  by 
watching other people’ s 
responses to us. If we’ re 
not satisfied with their 
responses, we can change 
our non-verbal communi­
cation to make it say what 
we want it to.

Out of^frbit

gjeflqo Stem Quesl <Atilst
^  . . .  u,.n Konies, Lonnie I

The Muleshoe Art As­
sociation, will meet Tues­
day. February 12. <" 
Muleshoe State Ban
Community Room.
p.m. . ,,

Helga Stein, of Shal o-
water will be the guest 
artist. She studied at Ray-
Vogue Art School, in Chi­
cago. She is a member of 
the Lubbock Art Associa­
tion. She has also received 
the top purchase prize in 
Reese AFB AirCraft exhi­
bit, also I.AA. membership 
ribbon.

Also- Helga, has had 
private lessons in Tokyo, 
Japan also workshops with

Ben Konies, Lonnie Ma­
son, Ramon Froman.

Helga has several years 
of experience, in ebrnmer- 
cial art. including a year as 
a USAF graphics illustra­
tor. five years as an il|us. 
trator for the Manned 
Space Center (NASA) in 
Houston.

She specialized in por- ij 
trait’ s and painting of Air- 
craft. Her paintings are 
owned all over the world.

What Now?
Spiritualist: “ Ah, 1 hear 

the spirit of your wife knock-
t *ing.
Widower: "Who is she 

knocking now?"

1 9 4
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AND REMEMBER DEAR. IF YOU GET 
THE f  HV4CE,THE BOYS WOUIO 
uxr A SMALL METEOR FOR THE
COB SCOOTS ! z f  y
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Get together with the light buttery taste of PARKAY. 
Americas favorite margarine, and the oven-hot freshness of 
Pillsbury Americas favorite brand of biscuits And get in on 
the savings 10© off on one lb of Soft PARKAY Margarine 

from Kraft, and 12© off on four 10-biscuit size cans of 
Pillsbury Buttermilk* or Country Style Biscuits Save 22C 

m all Great taste and great savings from America s 
favorites Now that's a great deal1
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M onday 
BREAKFAST

Milk 
Cereal 
Fruit

LUNCH
Milk
Steak and Gravy 
Creamed Potatoes 
Green Beans 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit

Tuesday
BREAKFAST
Milk
Honey Bun 
Fruit

LUNCH
Milk
Bar-B Oue on Bun 
Lettuce and Tomato 
Pickles and Onion 
Tater Tots 
Cobbler

W ednesday 
BREAKFAST

Milk 
T oast 
Jelly 
Fruit

LUNCH
Milk 
Lasagna 
Buttered Corn 
Salad
Corn Bread 
Fruit Pudding

Thursday
BREAKFAST

Milk
Honey Bun 
Juice

LUNCH
Milk
Hot Dogs 
Potato Salad 
Pork & Beans 
Cheese Sticks 
Cake

Friday
BREAKFAST

Milk 
Oatmeal 
Fruit 
T oast

LUNCH
Milk
Chicken Patties 
Blackeyed Peas 
Creamed Potatoes 
Hot Rolls 
Fruit

Video Tapes 
For Library

Student Council met 
February 6, 1980, at 8:00 
a.m. Mark Northcutt cal­
led the meting to order and 
Diana Saldana led the 
paryer. Joel Bratcher gave 
the treasurer’ s report, and 
the council now has a 
balance of SI,477.42. The 
Council made $169.16 
from the pantomime. The 
council will buy video 
tapes for the library, whith 
the cost for each about 
$ 22.00

The committee to seieci 
a movie to be shwn some­
time in April is Linda 
Shafer, Shelley Splawn, 
and Shelly Dunham.

Another Blood Drive is 
scheduld for March 27 
from 9:00 a.m. until 3:30 
p.m . Please give blood if at 
all possible on this date.

Home Truth 
Some folks want to 

check government spcnd-

JOEL BRATCHER SANDY DUNBAR DENNIS WATSON JORONDA RHODES

Fellowship Of Christian Athletes
The Fellowship of Chris­

tian Athletes is the newest 
organization in Muleshoe 
High School. This year 
they have had several in­
teresting things going on. 
Tapes, films, and speakers 
have been on the agenda, 
along with in-depth dis­
cussion huddle groups. 
The athletes traveled to a 
mini-F.C.A. convention, 
that was being held at 
Panhandle State Univer­
sity, this past weekend.

The group’s last regular 
meeting was held Thurs 
day night in the High 
School gym. This was a 
recreational meeting con­
sisting of eating, volleyball 
and basketball.

The elite group is spon­
sored by Coach Dean Cor­
nelius. He is a new coach 
at Muleshoe High School 
and teaches at Muleshoe 
Junior High School.

The other High School 
coaches also help out in 
the meetings. There are 
approximately 40 mem­
bers in F.C.A. The annual 
staff would like to intro­
duce the F.C.A. officers. 
Good luck in this very 
worthwhile organization.

Sandy Dunbar is the 
F.C.A.Treasurer and the 
17 year old daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Lee 
Dunbar. Her activities are 
band, basketball, Student 
Council, Varsity Cheer­
leader, Stage Band and 
F.T.A. Her comments 
were; “ F.C.A. is some­
thing just introduced this 
year. We are a small group 
but we really are excited 
and the group as a whole 
has enthusiasm. Our 
coaches are fantastic lead­
ers and we have a really 
good time together; We 
are small but our group is 
close and ready to
grow...”

JoRonda Rhodes is the 
17 year old daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Rhodes. 
She is the F.C.A Presi­
dent and her activities 
include being Senior Class 
President, FTA Secretary- 
Treasurer, Student
Council Historian, Mule- 
train-Mule's Tale Staff, 
head Varsity Cheerleader, 
basketball and tennis. Her 
comments were: ” 1 im so 
glad that we have been 
lucky enough to get F.C.A. 
in our school w Nile I'm still 
in high school. I think it's 
just super great and I hope 
the group will continue to 
grow both in members and 
spiritually. I would just 
like to thank Coach 

effort

time and concern to the 
betterment of F.C.A. '”

Dennis Wat son is the 17 
year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jinks Meyers. He is 
F.C.A. Vice-President and 
is also involved in FTA, 
football, tennis and is the 
Student Council Represen­
tative. “ F.C.A. really 
means a lot to me and I am 
very glad to be a member.
I hope we can get more 
members because F.C.A. 
is for everyone, not just 
athletes. In this group, you 
can be open to everyone 
and share your feelings. 
It's a great group! ”

Joel Bratcher, F.C.A. 
Secretary, is the 18 year 
old son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Bratcher. His

Varsity
Mules

The Muleshoe Mules 
Varsity Basketball team 
has had a good two weeks 
winning 3 of their last 4 
games in District. With 
wins over Littlefield, 
Friona and Olton. The loss 
was a 50-4 decision to the 
1st half champion Morton 
Indians. The Mules finish­
ed up with 3 of their last 4 
games at home against 
Dimmitt this Friday, Little­
field Tuesday, February 
12, and Olton February 19. 
On Friday February 15 the 
boys travel to Friona for 
their one remaining road 
game after a very strong 
first half finish. The 
Mules should be a conten­
der for the 2nd half cham­
pionship, so come out and 
give these guys your sup­
port. Let’ s keep Mule 
Mania going strong.
FTA Convention

The F.T.A. State Con­
vention was held February 
1-2 Houston. Those in 
attending were Becky Tur­
ner, Michelle Agee, Leslie 
W agnon, Shelley Splawn, 
Brad Poynor, Zeke Pecina, 
and Clifford Watson and 
Mr. Stephen Johnson. 
Muleshoe had six voting 
delegate at the convention. 
Shelley Splawn competed 
in the Miss FTA contest 
and placed in the top six 
finalist in the State. Becky 
Turner conducted a Dist­
rict XVII meeting while 
there. Mike Northcutt re­
ceived a certificate for his 
leadership as District XVII 
President. Newly-elected 
district officers for next 
year will be Clifford Wat­
son as District President

activities are F.T.A., Art 
Club, Student Council, 
football, and tennis. He 
commented, “ I'm very ex­
cited about F.C.A. in 
Muleshoe High. I know 
that F.C.A . is going to be a 
great asset to our school. 
It’ s a great organization 
and has something for 
everyone interested. Our 
coaching staff and sponsor 
Coach Cornelius have been 
a great help to our organi­
zation.”

Happy 
Birthday

DECA Employer 
& Employee 

Of The Month

February 10 
Carla Shafer, Wesley

cook
February 11 

Becky Turner
February 12 

Jenny Ziegenfuss 
February 13

George Vela, Delores 
Flores

February 16 
Jose Ibarra

The Muleshoe High 
School chapter of Distribu­
tive Education Clubs of 
America has chosen Mr. 
Harvey Bass as employer 
of the month and Kanetha 
Hysinger as Outstanding 
Student for the month of 
February.

Mr. Bass has supported 
the DECA program for 
several years. His employ­
ees have commented that 
he has been very helpful in 
teaching the basic selling 
skills and that he has 
provided them with the 
opportunity to learn and 
grow under his careful 
guidance.

Kanetha Hysinger is the 
' 18 year old daugher of Mr. 
an Mrs. Jack Hysinger. 
She is a very dedicated 
person and fulfills her 
responsibilities as secre­
tary of the DECA Chapter 
with a smile aud great deal 
of dedication. Kanetha is 
truly an outstanding young 
lady. She believes that the 
DECA program is one of 
the best ways to teach 
students responsibility and 
leadership.

The DECA chapter says 
“ Congratulations”  to both 
of these well deserving 
people.”

Sunday, February 10-Sat- 
urday, February 16 -- Vo- 
Ag Department to San 
Antonia Livestock Show. 
DECA Free Enterprise 
Week

Tuesday, February 12 
Littlefield A&B Boys 

and Girls here
Friday, February 15 

Friona A&B Boys there 
Area VI V1CA Skill 

Olympics 
Friday. February 15-Sat-

Eastern New Mexico 
University is holding its 
Talent Scholarship and 
Career Day on March 1, 
1980. Registration and 
meet faculty will be held 
from 8:00-9:00 a.m. in the 
Student Union Lobby. 
Faculty will be set up in 
the back of the ballroom 
with signs for their areas.

From 8:30 - 9:00 there 
will be briefing for
counselors and parents on 
Interest Inventory. Coffee 
and donuts will be served 
in the Mesquite Room.

From 9:00 - 9:20 a media 
show will be held in the 
ballroom. A general as­
sembly will be held in the 
CUB from 9:20 - 9:40.
Following the assembly, 
participants for Talent Day 
will be escorted to testing 
areas. 9:50-10:50 will be I 
Talent testing with the 
Educational Interest In­
ventory at 11:00 a.m. This 
measures the relative in­
terest a student lias (at this 
point in his development) 
in twenty-two of the major 
areas of study common to 
most colleges.

Lunch will be in the 
Cafeteria or Coffee Shop 
from 12:00-1:00. 1:00-
1:25 is Career Planning in 
the CUB directed by Dr. Jo 
Nell Brooks. 1:30 -2:15 will 
be Entertainment in the 
CUB by the Fine Arts 
Department. The Awards 
Assembly will be in the 
CUB from 2:15-4:15 a se­
cond Interest Inventory 
will be conducted. Stu­
dents are encouraged to 
visit with the faculty dur­
ing registration time so 
they can answer any ques­
tions about their areas of 
study. The game room, 
bowling museums are also 
a/ailable to give campus
tours. __
available to give campus 
tours.

Career Planning at 1:00 
will be very valuable and 
the theatre presentation 
will be an outstanding 
performance.

Talent scholarships 
testing areas should be 
placed on the Talent Scho­
larship application. 
COLLEGE OF BUSINESS 

Business: Standar­
dized test based on a 
general knowledge of gen­
eral math and the social 
sciences. For students in­
terested in accounting, 
business education, bus­
iness information systems, 
finance, insurance, man­
agement, marketing, per­
sonnel, real estate, and 
secretarial sciences. 

COLLEGE OF 
EDUCATION AND 

i TECHNOLOGY
Agriculture: Multiple 

The Muleshoe Varsity choice test including live- 
Basketball girls defeated stock and soils. Also an 
the Morton girls in a essay on agriculture in- 
one-sided game, 66-52. terest.

Shelly Dunham played Education: Rating scale 
extremely well for the based on questionnaire 
Mulettes and scored 25 answered by each student, 
points while Kathleen Pat- Includes essay item, 
terson came through se- Psychology: Same as 
cond highest scorer with education.

Home Economics: Fifty 
15 points. objective type questions

The Malette* shot really covering all phases of 
well from Die free shot line home economics. One 
hitting 85 percent of their short essay, 
free shots. Industrial Education:

This game brought their Objective test in any of 
district record up to 7-1. three areas chosen by the

KANETHA HYSINGER

HARVEY BASS

Varsity
Basketball

tions concerning libraries, 
media centers, books, and 
other media. There will be 
questions to answer for 
certain reference sources 
and a time for informal 
visitation.

Physical Education (men 
& women): A personal 
interview and the partici­
pant should bring or for­
ward a letter of recom­
mendation concerning 

%igh school performance 
and ability

Technical Institute/ 
Engineering: Practical
examination and personal 
interview.
COLLEGE OF FINE ARTS

Art: Each student
must bring a recommenda­
tion from an art teacher 
and a portfolio consisting 
of original examples of his 
or her work in a variety of 
artistic mediums. Students 
will be asked to write 
about their philosophy, 
aspirations and long term 
goals in art.

Dance: All applicants
must (1) take a 1'/a hour 
master class; (2) bring 
ballet or pointe shoes or go 
barefoot; (3) wear leotard 
and tights; (4) have hair 
pulled back out of face • no 
jewelry. Appplicants will 
be judged on the
following: (1) ability to 
move and perform, and (2) 
rhythm, coordination, and 
memory.

Drama: Students in
acting must prepare a five 
minute monologue or 
cutting from a scene or 
play. Students in technical 
Theatre should prepare a 
resume' and / or portfolio 
of their work which will be 
reviewed by a representa­
tive of the Department. All
students may wish to pro­
vide letters of recom­
mendation.

Music: Students will
present one or two pre­
pared numbers with a 
maximum of six minutes 
performing time. Music 
need not be memorized. If 
accompanist is needed,

' please notify the College 
Fine Arts when submitting 
application. Auditions will 
serve for Talent Scholar­
ships Day and other 
scholarships at a later 
date. Competitors should 
specify on the application 
on which instrument (or) 
voice they will audition, 
and also whether baritone 
voice or baritone instru­
ment, 
cont.
COLLEGE OF LIBERAL
ARTS AND SCIENCES 

English: Be prepared 
for essay examination.

Journalism, Radio & 
Television: Journalism
participants will be asked 
to write a short essay exam 
and will write a news story 
from facts presented. 
Radio & Television parti­
cipants will compete in one 
of the following areas of 
their choice: (1) News- 
writing for Radio-Televi­
sion. Bring 2-5 minutes of 
newscopv that you have 
written and be prepared to 
reat it; t2' Announcing - 
Newscopy will be provid­
ed. You should bring a 
30-second memorized 
commercial for TV. (3) 
Radio • TV production. 
Bring audio cassette or 

For TV,

Mathematics: Twenty
problems in the area of 
algebra and simple
analysis such as might be 
found in Algebra II or 
College Algbra classes.

Military Science: An
essay test on selected sub­
jects of the role of the US 
Military in society or the 
US Military as a force for 
world peace.

Modern Language:
Competition will be in 
either Spanish or French. 
Materials pertinent to the 
tests are supplied. Listen­
ing and reading compre­
hension will be tested 
using a nationally stan­
dardized test. In addition, 
a one-page composition 
will be required of all 
participants.

Religion: Objective test 
over the Old and New 

Science: General test in 
science. (Biology, Chem­
istry, Physics, Earth
Science.)

Social Science: Machine 
-graded test geared for 
social studies students 
with questions from the 
follwing areas: Antro- 
pology, History, Geogra­
phy, Sociology, and
Political Science.

Speech: In the area of 
public speaking, the stu­
dent should prepare a 
five-minute persuasive 
speech on a subject of 
national interest. Be pre­
pared to answer any ques­
tions that the judge may 
have about your topic.

Speech/Language Path­
ology and Audiology: 
Competition in these 
should prepare a report of 
500 words or more on some 
specific area of speech 
/language pathology o t  

audiology or on the field in 
general and include a 
statement describing their 
particulaj interest.

Amarillo
Speech

Tournament
Muleshoe High’s speech 

squad placed fourth out of 
forty-one teams competing 
at the Amarillo Tascosa 
Speech Tournament Feb­
ruary 1-2.

Fran Berryhill placed 
first in women’s extem­
poraneous speaking,
Debra Bouchelle won third 
in women's extemp and 
qualified for the State 
Texas Forensics Tourna­
ment in Arlington, March 
6-8.

Julius Briscoe placed 
first in poetry interpreta­
tion; Carla Shafer fourth 
in dramatic interp, and 
Sandra Graves fourth in 
poetry interp.

The speech squad com­
peted at the Texas Tech 
tournament this weekend.

FHA News
The F.H.A. members 

will be concentrating on 
the FHA banquet and state 
and area meeting. A list 
will be compiled of mem­
bers who will attend the 
area meeting, which will 
be held February 22-23 in 
Amarillo.

A meeting will be called 
in the middle of the week
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Citizens...
Cont. from page 1

for the program received 
unanimous approval of 
commissioners court.

He then said a new 
application was approved 
in 1974 on a motion by 
Rudolph Moraw and 
second by Bob Sanders to 
pave the road and it still 
carried a Number One 
priority.

Then, on February 28, 
1975 a group of people 
met again with commis­
sioners court requesting a 
paved road in the south­
east part of the county, a 
designation of the road 
now being constructed, al­
though commissioners did 
not approve, on February 
28, to move the designa­
tion from the now called 
‘ east’ road one mile west 
to the ‘ west road’ for the 
paving project.

On March 18, continued 
the Judge, a meeting was 
conducted by the Bailey 
County Commissioners 
Court and attended by the 
four commissioners and 
two members of the high­
way department. Judge 
Williams said he did not 
attend the meeting, nor 
did County Clerk Hazel 
Gilbreath, who said she 
was informed the commi­
ssioners planned to take no 
formal action on anything, 
so no minutes of the 
meeting would be neces­
sary.

Judge Williams said 
that on that date, March 
18, 1975, the four commis­
sioners changed the loca­
tion of the road from the 
‘ east’ road to the west 
road. He said he did not 
know that the commis­
sioners had been the ones 
to change the location until 
Friday, February 1, 1980, 
when he was finally told 
the county commissioners, 
not the state, had changed 
the location. He said until 
Friday, February 1, 1980, 
he had been told
repeatedly for four years, 
10 months and two weeks 
that the state had changed 
the road and not the 
commissioners. He said at 
least one commissioner 
had told him previously, 
on a private basis, that the 
county commissioners had 
changed the location, an 
allegation the commis­
sioners continued to deny, 
he said until February 1 of

Trial...
Cont. from page 1

Jessie Gray, Horton Grif­
fin, J.C. Gatewood, 
Glenna Gregory, Gary D. 
Garlen, Norman R. Head. 
Larry B. Hall. J.W. 
Holmes, William T. Hut­
ton, Gloria Herrington, 
Darlene Henry, Rita W. 
Johnson, Willis James, 
Linda T. Key, Glenn R. 
Klesel, Ruben Leal, Don 
Lowe, Jack Lane, Austin 
R. Moore, Charles A. 
Moraw, Edwin Neutzler, 
Dean E. Northcutt, Mary 
J. Pool, Joe G. Perales, 
Clifton Randolph, Joe P. 
Rhodes, Ida K. Shofner, 
Ted Simpson, Joe B. 
Stevenson and Weldon

Scheduled to report at 
9:30 a.m. on Thursday, 
February 14, ar Walter 
Sain, Carolyn Sowder, 
June Saylor, Wanda Sha­
fer, Cara Schuster, Harold 
Toombs, Joe Tipton, Lloyd 
Throckmorton, Gary
Toombs, Jessie Villareal, 
Jess Winn, Joy Whitt, Pat 
Wagnon, Rheata White, 
Eddie Meeks, Sherry 
Washington and Hugh 
Young.
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this year. The change was 
not reflected in the min­
utes of the March 18, 1975 
meeting.

Then, on April 2, 1975, 
another delegation attend­
ed the Bailey County 
Commissioners Court to 
request commissioners 
reaffirm the ‘ east’ road 
designation for the paving 
project. Judge Williams 
said that neither he, or the 
group of people, were told 
the road had already been 
changed by commis­
sioners.

Then on a later date, an 
order was entered chang­
ing the designation to the 
‘ west’ road, with the judge 
still believing the state had 
changed the location.

Officials from the State 
Highway Department den­
ied during the meeting 
that they had changed the 
location for paving, insist­
ing that in all instances, a 
commisssioners court de­
signates all roads to be 
paved.

Judge Williams firmly 
told the group of residents 
of the southeast part of 
Bailey County “ If full 
information and truthful 
information had been put 
out when it should have 
been, this would have 
never happened.’ ’

Bradley also explained 
to the group that it would 
involve some $57,000 plus 
in extra expense to pave 
the ‘west’ road, and total 
construction would cost 
around $980,000, up by 
$300,000 since the road 
was first proposed.

It was estimated that the 
right-of-way purchases 
would be some $36,441 for 
the west road, while it was 
estimated it would cost 
around $19,250 should the 
‘ east’ road had been pav­
ed, or nearly twice as 
m uch.

Also, the estimate was 
some $40,000 more to pave 
the ‘west’ road as compar­
ed to the cost for the ‘ east* 
road. The right-of-way 
purchases are paid from 
county funds, and the bal­
ance from state funds.

Dale Thompson, a 
young farmer from the 
Bula community, carefully 
researched the proposed 
roads, and presented in­
formation from the U.S. 
Geological maps. He 
showed where there was 
only one water crossing on 
the formerly proposed 
‘ east’ road and four water 
crossings on the ‘west’ 
road.

Explaining that he lived 
on neither of the roads

under consideration, he 
also showed where it 
would cost more |o con-’ 
struct and maintain the 
‘ west’ road. Bradley con­
curred with Thompson’s 
explainations.

Also asking explicit 
questions was Edward 
Riley, pastor of the Bula 
Baptist Church. He asked 
questions about the priori­
ties for construction of the 
roads.

Bradley also conceded 
that a gully near the ‘west’ 
road “ will always be a 
problem.’ ’

“ Merits of the east road 
stand for themself,”  as­
serted Thompson, and 
Brad'ey added, “ It is the 
norma1 habit for a county 
to pick out the worst road 
they have and ask us to 
build it.”

George Wall commen­
ted, “ W e ’re interested in 
building roads where the 
county wants it and that’ s 
what we understand the 
county wanted, and the 
road is being built where 
they wanted it.”

Bennie Claunch was 
emphatic in asking ques­
tions, and literally ‘ pin­
ned’ down commissioners 
and members of the high­
way department as he 
sought answers to ques­
tions on who actually 
changed the location of the 
road and who had changed 
the priority of the road 
from the Number One.

Judge Williams inter­
jected, “ If the people had 
been told about the 
change, the truth about it, 
we would have had no 
confusion about it.”

Wallsaid that on March 
18, 1975, “ We went away 
from here with the under­
standing the commis­
sioners wanted the west 
road. Our understanding 
was that the priority was 
changed and we marked 
what the commissioners 
wanted on the map pi  
' ’ Claunch again asked

Moraw again who moved 
the road, and Commis­
sioner Loyd Stephens said, 
“ IF the road was never 
changed, I didn’ t know 
it.”

S'ephens said this des­
pite the fact that Judge 
Williams was told on Feb­
ruary 1, 1980, according to 
his statement, that the 
com missoners had
changed the location of the 
road to be paved.

The judge added, “ This 
is a real tragedy. There 
will be hard feelings 
between neighbors for 
years, and 1 hope and pray 
it will be resolved.

“ The mistakes have 
been made by the commis­
sioners court. You are 
neighbors. Blame us, not 
each other.”

On a disconsolate note 
for many of those attend­
ing the meeting, it was 
over. With the road to be 
built on the ‘ west’ road, 
and allegations of secret 
meetings, misrepresenta­
tion, and untruthfulness 
made against the four 
Bailey County Commis­
sioners.

Dalton...

Cont. from page 1 

County jail.
Dalton was apprehend­

ed around 11 a.m. Wed­
nesday near Shallowater 
by DPS Troopers. It was 
reported that Dalton was 
driving a 1980 sports 
model vehicle which had 
been reported as stolen at 
Littlefield around 4:45 
a.m. Wednesday.

He had been convicted 
of burglary in Bailey 
County last month, and 
had been given a life 
sentence as a habitual 
criminal. At the time of his 
escape, he was waiting for 
an appeal of his conviction.

Dalton was returned to 
the jail in Muleshoe 
around 4 p.m. Wednesday 
afternoon.
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{Etna has some
BEG NEW S

for Texas
Homeowners
Now you can save up to 25% 

on your homeowners insurance!
If your home was built after 1954, chances are you qualify 
for /Etna’s brand new Preferred Homeowners Policy.

This means, for example, if you are now paying a $400 
standard premium, you can save as much as $100!

With every /Etna policy our agency offers:

• Just the right coverage for your home and its contents
• A special paymeht plan so you can pay for your 

insurance in monthly installments
• Fast, reliable, 24-hour claim service for help when 

you need it.

Call us today. We’ll show you the big difference - the /E.tna 
difference - in Homeowners insurance.

Weather •••
»

Cont. from page 1

ed by fire. Mrs. Stewart 
told firemen the dog woke 
them up barking, or they 
may not have been able to 
get out of the blazing farm 
home.

A member of the Mule- 
shoe Fire Department said 
top speed trying to drive 
the ten miles to the fire 
was approximately 35 
miles an hour on the slick 
highways.

According to Mrs. Ste­
wart, the fire apparently 
began in the living room. 
She said they had a fire in 
their fireplace before retir­
ing for the night.

Muleshoe Firemen were 
further hampered by not 
having adequate water to 
fight the Stewart home 
fire. The Earth Fire 
Department brought their 
tank truck to the fire, but it 
was too late to salvage the 
home. Muleshoe firemen 
are still waiting for the 
tank truck to fight rural 
fires that was promised by 
the County Commission­
ers.
Thursday evening at 6:20 

p.m., a ‘big wind’ of 
unknown origin, as to 
whether or not it was a 
straight wind or a twister, 
inflicted heavy damage to 
a farm owned by Gene 
McGuire in the Oklahoma 
Lane community. McGuire 
said the people who lived 
in the house believed the 
damage to be from torna- 
dic winds, but could not be 
certain.

He said a large plate 
glass window was blown 
out of the house on the 
north side and slammed 
into a wall 15 feet to the 
south; at least 10 cotton 
trailers were totally 
destoryed; a combine was

blown across listered rows 
50 yards into a field; three 
to four telephone poles 
were broken off across the 
road from the house; a well 
house was destroyed, 
along with the pump; a 
fuel tank wi*h some fuel 
inside was blown for 
approximately one half 
mile, while a nearby empty 
200 gallon fuel tank was 
not touched.

He also said that gaited 
pipe was picked out of a 
pipe stand in a field and 
scattered across fields for 
a mile; tree limbs were 
twisted off and all over the 
yard.

McGuire also said the 
high wind of unknown 
origin was also accompan­
ied by big sleet or large 
soft hail. All the damage
occurred approximately 18 
miles northwest of Mule­
shoe.

Wednesday night, just 
before the storm moved 
into the area, a home in 
north Muleshoe was 
heavily damaged by fire. 
Firemen from the Mule­
shoe Fire Department 
were at the fire for approx­
imately an hour and a half.

DECA...
Cont. from page 1

group that collects the 
most money; the best 
decorated rocking chair; 
and door prizes for specta­
tors and participants, 
which were contributed by 
local merchants.

If you are interested in 
participating or assisitng 
this event, please coniact 
any DECA member or Lola • 
Pylant at home, 272-5034 
or at Mulehoe High 
School. 272-3080.

Deputy Bob Henderson 
checked on a reported 
abandoned vehicle in the 
Stegall area near the New 
Mexico state line Thursday 
and found the vehicle had 
been reported stolen near 
Austin.

One person was appre­
hended for bond forfeit 
and three persons were 
returned to the Bailey 
County jail from near Fort 
Worth by Deputy James 
Henderson and City Police 
Detective Hal Bynum on 
charges of Burglary and 
cattle theft.

*****

“Liars when they speak the 
truth are not believed."

Aristotle

i Thank You!
The Bailey County Concession Stand

Committee Would Like To Thank The 
Following People For Their Contributions:

Terry WheelerJMary Janice Brantley, Donna Black, 
Norma Prat he r. Pay -A- Save, Cashtcays, Winkler Meats, 
James Roy MeatsJMorton Foods-Lloyd Garling ton ,
Spud nut Shop-Beth & Cleo Webb. Janie Lou Moraw &
All Parents Who Donated Baked Goods & Worked Shifts In 
The Stand.

I$

!

1
52*

I
I

*

All Proceeds Will Be Used By The 
4-H Adult Leaders In 4 -H Projects 
&By The Ag Boosters With Their 
FFA Student Activities

Terry Field Insurance 
Agency

B U N D L E  U P
Here are some tips that w ill help you 

wrap up your home to use energy more
efficiently.

•Add an extra blanket of insulation in 
the attic. ‘ Secure ductwork joints with 
screws and wrap w ith tape to stop air 

loss. ‘ Feel warmer by installing storm 
doors and windows

Muleshoe, Texas 
1534 W. Amer. Blvd.

Th* Standard Fir* lq»ur«nc« Company o(

Phone: 272-3252 

Business: 272-5551

SOUTH'

Winter is here and time
to bundle up to 
be warmer and 

more efficient 
with the energy 
you use.

•Change the heating unit air filter when 
dirty. ‘ Caulk and weatherstrip air leaks 
and infiltration around all doors and
windows.
That about wraps it up fa  the basics 
It s good to know there are some thinqs 
you can do and depend on to te  more 
comfortable this winter.



Bailey County Journal, Sunday February 10, I98U, Page 9

STEWARD OF THE SOIL--H arm on Elliott congratulates Kirk Cunningham of 
Lubbock on presenting what was termed ‘an outstanding program’ for the Muleshoe 
Rotary Club Tuesday. Looking on in the background as Elliott thanks Cunningham is 
Clinton Kennedy, Rotary President.

Rotary...
Cont. from page 1

“ Man is just one more 
of mother nature's crea­
tures," added Cunning­
ham, “ but, he has his 
intellect as the finest re­
finement of nature.”

It was brought out that 
the Steward of the Soil is 
the first environmentalist 
and farmers’ problems 
affect both the supply and 
cost of food through ex­
pensive equipment and 
continuing rises in costs to 
produce a crop.

Farmers are one of the 
few businesses who do not 
set their own prices, added 
the speaker. They are 
often caught in the middle, 
he said.

“ One more farm house 
goes dark,”  he warned, 
“ All across the land, lights 
are going out. But, the 
lights don’ t stay out for 
long, and the land re­
mains.”

Agriculture is the big­

gest business in the 
nationa, warned Cunninh- 
ham, but continuing rises 
in prices are forcing more 
and more farmers from the 
land, and into the cities. 
Many are now farming and 
taking an outside job in 
town, just to be able to 
continue living on the 
farm.

He cited the slower pace 
of living, the sense of 
belonging, the feeling that 
their life counts for some- 
ting, and the fact that their 
faith stays intact as some 
of the reasons for the 
farmer to continue with his 
never-ending battle
against rising prices, 
adverse weather and 
insect festations.

"We can no longer take 
agriculture for granted or 
ignore its needs,”  he war­
ned, and reminded all 
businessmen that , the' 
educated farmer today is 
to be counted in what is 
happening all across the

Correction O f Error That 
Appeared In Ads Thurs. Jan 31 

&, Sun Feb 3.

Male,Age 1 Cash Yalues
10th year....................*12.000.00
Should Be................... .*1,200.00

20th Year.................. *6:1000
Should B e ...................6.300

65th Year......................
Should B e............... *52.800

Tom Hudson Life Ins.
Ph. 505-763-7780

2905 N. Prince St. Suite I). Clovis, N.M.

nation--and the world.
The Valentine Party for 

Rotarians and Rotary- 
Anns will be at 7 p.m. on 
Tuesday, February 12 at 
the Bailey County Exhibi­
tion Center and Coliseum. 
There will be no noon 
meeting that day.

Rotarian Dave Marr 
presented a Rotar Emblem 
clock, which was installed 
in the meeting room at the 
Bailey County Exhibition 
Center and Coliseum.

Special guests at the 
meeting were John Gulley, 
manager of the Muleshoe 
Chamber of Commerce 
and Agriculture, and Cleta 
Williams of The Journal.

Annual Symposium

Farm Production
Current research to help 

producers balance the 
costs and availability of 
energy against crop out­
puts will be detailed 
Thursday, February 14, 
during the annual Crop 
Production and Utilization 
Symposium at the Texas 
A&M University Research 
and Extension Center 
here.

Scientists from the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture 
Southwestern Great Plains 
Research Center at Bush- 
land amd the Texas Agri­
cultural Experiment Sta­
tion (TAES) at Amarillo 
and Lubbock will report on 
work relating to agricultur­
al supply and use of ener­
gy, said Dr. G.B. Thomp­
son, resident director of 
research at the Amarillo 
center.

IT PAYS TO PLANT

A  r
V

UC 8951 IS a record breaker 
★ Big Yields ★ Superior stalk and root 
systems ★ Long, big girthed ears 
★ Deep kernels on hard cobs 
★ Good disease tolerance including 
Downy Mildew and MDMV

★  This Uni-Cross* upright leaf hybrid has the 
exceptional ability to dry down faster than 
other hybrids in its maturity class 
★ Long, high girth, medium dent ears with 
hard cobs for easy shelling 
★ Exceptional adaptation to narrow rows 
and high population 
★ Strong stalks and thick rinds improve 
standability for harvest even under rough 
weather conditions
★ Good tolerance to head smut and other 
diseases
Ask your dealer about Paymaster s 
Ime-up of new Uni-Cross * Corn Hybrids 
especially bred for this area

F. L. (JACKIE) BROWN 
RIVERSIDE CHEMICAL

Monday
BREAKFAST

Cereal
Juice
Milk

LUNCH
Enchilada 
Pinto Beans 
Salad 
Hot Rolls 
Milk 
C ake

Tuesday
BREAKFAST

Tasted Buns
Juice
Milk

LUNCH
Turkey and Cheese
Sandwich
Green Peas
Lettuce and Tomatoes
Milk
Jello with fruit

W edensday 
BREAKFAST

Cinnamon toast
Juice
Milk

LUNCH
Fish with Tarter Sauce
CornSlaw
Hot Rolls
Milk
No-Bake Cookies 

Thursday 
BREAKFAST

French Toast
Juice
Milk

LUNCH
Cheese and Macaroni 
Baked Beans 
Salad 
Milk
Peanut Butter Cookies 

Friday
BREAKFAST

W affles and Syrup
J u ice
Milk

LUNCH
Hamburgers 
French Fries 
Onions, Pickles 
Tomatoes, Lettuce 
Milk 
Cookies

The symposium, in the 
auditorium of the center at 
6500 Amarillo Blvd. West, 
will begin at 10 a.m. and 
conclude at 4 p.m. A 
dutch treat lunch will be 
provided.

The keynote address, 
“ Energy--W hat Lies
Ahead,”  will be delivered 
by T.B. Pickens, president 
of Mesa Petroleum, Ama­
rillo.

Each session will in­
clude a period for audience 
questions and discussion.

Best Of Press
We should be gentle with 

those who err, not in 
will, but in judgment.

-Sophocles.

■ The Lonely Heart

F  - •  *PdogI
iSHOWi

X tr.l

“Block goes with 
me to the IRS? 

Free?
I shoulda come 
here last year.”

Iw

We re trained to know every 
deduction and credit the law al­
lows And if the IRS calls you 
in, we ll go with you, free Not 
as a legal representative but to 
explain how your taxes were 
prepared

H&R BLOCK
THE INCOME TAX PEOPLE

224 W. 2nd 
Ph. 272-3332

Muleshoe...
Cont. from page 1 
division, an area that 
ranges from South Dakota 
to Mississippi according to 
G. Dean Edwards, vice 
president of sales.

“ The continued growth 
of Western Sprinklers in

Cable testing
AUSTIN, Texas (Spl.) — 

University of Texas civil 
engineers have been chosen to 
make the largest performance 
tests ever on cables to be used 
in the longest (2,225 feet) 
cable-stayed steel bridge in 
the U.S.. now being built 
across the Mississippi River 
at Luting, La.

UT's Phil M Ferguson 
Structural Engineering 
Laboratory is the only facility 
in the country which has the 
capability of producing the 
kind of force needed for 
testing the cable, which is 
made of 307 one-quarter-inch 
wires.

The UT engineers will sub­
ject the steel cable to forces 
up to 4 5 million pounds, using 
a custom-built center-hole 
ram (a device comparable to 
a hydraulic jack).

A man has need of tough 
ears to hear himself 
freely judged.
-Michel de Montaigne.

1979 exemplifies the dedi­
cation this dealership has 
not only towards the pro­
ducts they sell, but also to 
their customers and

thon to raise funds which 
will support research and 
care for Cystic Fibrosis 
children.

com m unity,”  
said.

Edwards

*****
Bovina Young Home-

makers will sponsor
volleyball tournament
M arch 6-8.

For additional informa­
tion and entry blanks, call 
Nancy Rundell at 806/225- 
6895 or Toni Barett at 
806/825-3575.

Knights of Columbus of 
the Immaculate Concep­
tion Catholic Chruch will 
host a blood drive for 
South Plains Blood Ser­
vices of Lubbock on Wed­
nesday, February 13, 6;8 
p.m. at the Catholic Center 
in M uleshoe.

Additional information 
is available from Alfonso 
Posadas at 272-3269.

* * * * *

Jan Powell has accept­
ed the chairmanship of the 
Spring Bike-A-thon on 
behalf of the Cystic Fibro­
sis Foundation. She will be 
conducting the Bike-A-

PTA will meet Mon­
day, February 11 at Rich­
land Hills School. The exe­

cutive meeting will be at 
3:15 p.m. followed by the 
general meeting at 3:45 
p.m .

Baby sitters will be 
available and the program 
will be presenting the Life 
Membership and electing 
the nominating committee 
for 80-81 officers.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. Buck 
Creamer were notified Sat­
urday morning of the 
death of their neice, nine 
year old Tennise Rothwell 
of Fort Riley, Ks. the 
daughter of Sgt. and Mrs. 
W alter Rothwell.
She had been an invalid 

all of her life. Funeral 
services were scheduled 
for 2 p.m. Monday in the 
First Baptist Church in 
Kirkland, Tx.
She was a cousin of Cleat 

Williams, also of Mule­
shoe.

S im p le  &  Q u ic k

. . .  the 
24 hour

T

bank

j M U L E S H O E l  
S T A T E  B A N K

101 AMERICAN BLVD. •  272-4561 • Member FDIC

More than a Sale!
STARTING AT

165 13 XWXB/W 
FFT 51 79

Regular Michelin Exchange: $70.56

M IC H E L IN  X
WHITEWALL

Size
Reg
Exch

Mania
Price Size

Reg
Exch.

Mania
Price

165-13 70.56 39 88 165-15 74.49 53.50
175-13 74.74 53.50 195-15 94.80 68.50
175 14 79.18 56.50 205-15 104.18 77.50
195-14 90.54 65.50 215-15 110.05 79.50
205-14 98.00 70.50 225-15 114.69 83.50
215-14 104.03 74.50 235 15 137.39 94.50

E x c h a n g e  • F E T : $ 1 .7 5  ■ 3 .38

Register today 
for a  set of Michelins

ComputerBalance Wheel Alignment
Recommended 
For steel belted 
redials

5.00
M ag w hpel 

slightly higher

m m

TIRE COMPANY

During Shook's Michelin Mania, each store will 
give away a free set of Michelin X Steel Belted 
Radials for passenger cars. Simply come in and 
register at your convenient Shook Tire Store 
Winners will be selected at random March 9 
Winners need not be present to win If winner has 
already purchased a set of Michelin passenger 
tires from Shook within 90 days ol drawing, his 
original purchase amount will be refunded



+ . V

; l

W.D. LACKEY
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W.D, Lackey Services Held Thursday
Services for W.D. Lack­

ey, 69, were held Thurs­
day, February 7 at 4 p.m. 
in the Chapel of the 
Chimes, with Rev. Jimmy 
Low paster of the New 
Convenant Church officiat­
ing.

Burial was in the Mule- 
shoe Cemetary, under the 
direction of Singleton Ellis 
Funeral Home.

Lackey died February 5, 
at 8:30 p.m. in the Metho­
dist Hospital in Lubbock.

Lackey was born Feb­
ruary 22, 1912 in Hamilton 
County and married Ruth 
Reeder, December 2, 1931 
in Lovington, N.M. He 
had been a resident of 
Muleshoe for two years, 
moving here from the 
Pleasant Valley Com­
munity, where he had 
resided since 1946.

He was a farmer and 
Member of the New Cove­
nant Church.

Survivors include his 
wife, Ruth; a son, Walter 
of Muleshoe, a daughter 
Mrs. Mary Margaret 
Towner of Albuquerque,
N.M., riOther, Mrs. Mary 
Lackey of Lubbock, six 
sisters; Mrs. Emma
Greaser, Estacada, Ore­
gon, Mrs. Geneva Snyder,
Ropesville, Mrs. Evelyn 
Goode, Smyer, Mrs. Mary 
Lee McChagren, and Mrs.
Jean Landerson both of 
Levelland, Mrs. Nell 
Thomason, of Stamford, 
five brothers; James F. 
and John D both of 
Ruidoso, N.M.; Orville 
and Homer of Muleshoe,
Elmer of Lubbock and five 
grandchildren and four 
great grandchildren.

Three W ay  

News
By Mrs. H.W. Garvin

The Three Way basket­
ball teams played Bledsoe 
at Bledsoe Tuesday night 
winning both games.

*••••* v ! |6 ;«
Mrs. J.T. Lemons from 

Roswell, N.M. spent the 
week end with her daught­
er the Bobby Kindle 
*amily.

Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Furgeson visited in Shal- 
lowater Sunday, with their 
daughter, the Jim Green 
Family. Their grand­
daughter, Millisa Green, 
came home with her 
grandparents for a visit. 

*****
Kristin Corkery from 

Whitherrell spent the 
week end visiting Tammy 
Davis.

*****

Three Way Baptist 
women, met Monday 
morning for their meeting 
with Ima Roberts leading 
the Bible study.

*••••
Three Way basketball 

teams played Sundown 
Friday night, at Sundown 
with the Three Way girls 
winning, and Three Way 
boys loosing.

Joe Wheeler and 
daughters, Belinda and 
Jodie spent the past week 
in Ft. Worth showing 
stock at the fat stock show. 
They brought home some 
prizes.

*****

Mr. and Mrs. W.M. 
Eubanks and Mr. and Mrs. 
George Tyson were in 
Lubbock Thursday, even­
ing on business.

R.C. Davis Sr. 
Funeral Rites 
Are Pending

Funeral serivces were 
pending at presstime at 
Singleton-Ellis Funeral 
Home for R.C. Davis, 65, 
who resided in the Lazbu- 
ddie community. He was 
pronounced dead of natu­
ral causes at his home by 
Albert Sm ith, justice of the 
peace from Farwell. He 
apparently died around 
12:45p.m . Friday.
R.C. Davis was born 

March 20, 1914 in Hopkins 
County, Texas and had 
resided in the Lazbuddie 
community since 1966, 
moving there from Earth. 
He was a farmer. He was a 
member of the First Bap­
tist Church at Lazbuddie 
and a veteran of World 
War II, having served in 
the U.S. Air Force.

Survivors include his 
wife, Robbie; one son, 
R.C. Davis Jr., Oklahoma 
Lane; one daughter, Mrs. 
Percy Creitz, Vega; Three 
sisters, Mrs. John Pickel, 
Mrs. Lee Hughey and 
Mrs. Nina Tompson, all of 
Dallas; one brother, Willie 
Davis, Wichita Falls and 
four grandchildren.

Joshua Winders
Services
Thursday

Funeral serives for 
Jashua William Winders, 
six month old son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Randy Winders 
of Lazbuddie, were held, 
Thursday, February 7, at 2 
p.m. in the First Baptist 
Church of Lazbuddie with 
Rev. Jim Standridge
officiating.

Burial was in the Laz­
buddie Cemetery under 
the direction of Singleton 
Ellis Funeral Home.

He died February 4, in 
the Texas Childrens 
Hospital in Houston.

He was born August 3, 
1979 in M uleshoe.

Survivors include his 
parents Mr. and Mrs. 
Randy Winders, a sister, 
Michelle and brother, 
Justin, both of the home. 
Grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bud Street, Bailey- 
boro, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dub Winders, Lazbuddie, 
great grandparents; Mrs. 
Willie Winders, Lubbock 
and Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
McCloup; Great grand 
father; Bill Williams of 
Jarel.

IDA SINA COLLINS

—
Church of

to

1
-<

Christ
th  anb 9brnur £

S E R V IN G  CHRIST AND  
OUR FELLOW MAN

lunday 10:30 a m  

6:00 pm

cPkoudQy u4nnou»ices

Tim Smith
Box 163 Lazbuddie,Tex 79053 

806-265-3325
Has been appointed New Northrop King Seed Dealer 

handling C o r n .C o llo n jS u n flo u p r .M ilo  Xr

S o y b e a n

More From Every Acre Through CreativeSeed Research. 

N O R T H R U P  K I NG i  C U

Ida S. Collins 
Services Monday

Funeral services for 
Ida Sina (Nairn) Collins, 
84, will be at 11 a.m. 
Monday in the Muleshoe 
Church of Christ. Officiat­
ing will be Royce Clay, 
Church of Christ minister 
from Big Spring, and John 
B. White of Lubbock.

Burial will be at 2:30 
p.m. Monday in the city of 
Lubuock cemetery. Mrs. 
Collins died ai 4:10 a.m., 
Friday in the West Plains 
Medical Center.

Mrs. Ida Collins was

born January 20, 1896 in 
Lubbock. She married 
Robert s. Collins in 1921. 
Shortly after her husbands 
death in 1947, Mrs. Collins 
built a home just east of 
what is now Childrens 
Home of Lubbock.

She donated 200 acres 
for the beginning of the 
Chilrens Home.

Mrs. Collins moved to 
the Pleasant Velley Com­
munity Northeast of Mule- 
shoe in 1960, from Lub­
bock, and had lived in this

area until her death. She 
was a member of the 
Church of Christ in Mule­
shoe.

Survivors include a 
daughter; Mrs. E.C. Cal­
yon of the Pleasant Valley 
Community. Four grand­
children and six great 
grand children.

The family request that 
memorials be made to the 
Childrens Home of Lub­
bock.

Ford closing Calif, plant 
after car sales slump.

Best Of Press
DefinitionHangover; Something to occupy a head that wasn't used the night be­fore.-Review, Plymouth, Wis.

i  » 0 0 » 0 8 9>0<

There are peopie in the world who hate to pay anyone for anything.
• * * * ^There is great danger that what we considerimportant is unimportant.

• *  *  *

Jana Is Back!
Jana St.Clair 

Is Back At Ana’s.

CAR-SENSE
Ed Edmiston

As your d*al*r. I would be th* first to admit to you that 
car repairs have been caught up in inflation. Overhauling 
the enigne brakes transmisaion, ale., not to mention body 
work, is expensive. You will find many times it is more 
advisable to trad* for a new car than it is to repair one. It 
might be advisable before you do a lot of repairing on your 
old vehicle lo come by and let us make you an offer for it 
on a new car. Who knows you might catch ua In a position 
of being overstocked on new cars and in need of used ones 
and make a few bucks. Never know until you try and we 
will sure make you an offer without any obligation to you.

Muleshoe Motor Co.
1225 West American —  272-4251

General Cement 
Construction

All Types Cement Work
Big or Small

Specializes In: Storm Cellars
Slab Foundations, Metal Buildings 

Sidewalks & Drives.

Free Estimates

Garcia Bros.
Hereford, Tex. 

614 Ave. K
Phone 364-3507 
Moble 578-4692

She Invites All O f Her
Friends & Former 

Customers To Call 
( For An Appointment

A t  2 7 2 - 4 1 5 2

On Wed. & Thurs.

L e n a ’s  Wouse CQ|5 
beauty

272-4152 !

ATTEND THE CHURCH 
OF YOUR CHOICE

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
Ninth and Avenue C 
Dana Sbunko, Paator
FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH
130 W. Avenue G 
Rev. Walter Bartholf 
Suncay School 10 a.m.
Worship 11 a.m.
LATIN AMERICAN 
METHODIST MISSION 
Avenue D. and Fifth Street 
R.O. Chavez. Pastor
THE COMMUNITY CHURCH
H.D. Hunter, Pastor 
Morton Highway 
CALVARY BAPTIST CHURCH
James Williams, Pastor 
1733 W. Avenue C
FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH
Rev. David Hamblin 
507 West Second, Muleshoe
PRIMITIVE BAPTIST CHURCH
621 South First 
Elder Bernard Gowens
MULESHOE ASSEMBLY OF 
GOD
517 South First 
Rev. Joe Stone
EMMANUEL BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Iglesia Bautista Emmanuel 
107 E. Third 
Isaias Cardenas, Pastor 
RICHLAND HILLS BAPTIST 
CHURCH
17th and West Ave. D 
Roy L. Sikes, Pastor 
SPANISH BAPTIST MISSION 
Rev'. Ynes Aleman 
East Third and Avenue E
TRINITY BAPTIST CHURCH
314 Ave. B.
Rev. Gene Prevo
MULESHOE CHURCH OF 
CHRIST
David Cox, minister 
Clovis Highway

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH
220 West Ave E 
Rev. J.E. Meeks

Western Drug

114 Main 272-3106

Bratcher Motor 
Supply

107 E. Ave. B 272-4288

4 Dairq 
Queen

Margie Hawkins, 

Manager

272-3412

St. Clair’s

110 Main 272-4453

Baker Form 
Supply. Inc.
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jig:

Johnnie’s Safety 
Center -

320 E. Amer. Blvd. 272-3043

Watson Alfalfa
Alfalfa Hay

272-3552

Jaires Roy Meat 
Market Co.

,506 W. An»er. Blvd. 272-4361

w 401 S. First 
Muleshoe

L Western 
ee’s Wear

1910 V . Amer. Blvd.’ 272-4663

PROGRESS SECOND BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Clifford Slay, Pastor
1st and 3rd Sundays___
ST. MATHEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Corner of West Boston & 
West Birch.
Rev. M.S. Brown, Pastor 
LONGVIEW BAPTIST 
CHURCH
Pastor B.C. Stonecipher 
Phone 946-3413
SIXTEENTH AND AVENUE D 
CHURCH OF CHRIST
Sunday - 10:30 
Evening - 6 p.m.
Wednesday - 8 p.m.
Terry Bouchelle, Minister
PROGRESS BAPTIST CHURCH
Progress, Texas
Rev. Gearld Albers, Pastor
NORTHSIDE CHURCH
OF CHRIST
117 E. Birch Street
SPANISH
ASSEMBLY OF GOD
East 6th and Ave. F.
Rev. Hipolito Pecina
ST. JOHN LUTHERAN 
CHURCH
Lariat, Texas
Herman J. Schelter-Pastor 
Sunday School Classes 
10:00 a.m.
Worship Services 
11:00 a.m.
MULESHOE 
BAPTIST CHURCH
8th Street and Ave. G.
Bob Dodd, Pastor
JEHOVAH’S WITNESS 
Friona Highway 
Boyd Lowery. Minister 
IMMACULATE 
CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Father Patrick Mahar 
Northeast of City in 
Morrison Edition 

UNITED PENTECOSTAL 
GOSPEL LIGHTHOUSE 
CHURCH
George Green, Pastor 

207 E. Ave G

Whites Cashway 
Grocery

‘Where Friends Meet 
402 Main &  Prices Talk’

Dent-Rempe 
Implement Co.

John Deere Dealer 
Muleshoe______________ 272-4297

Muleshoe Co-Op 
Gins

Western Sprinklers,

Roy Whitt 
Chevrolet

201 Main 272-3100

Bailey County 
Memorial Park

‘Every Service A Sacred Trust’ 
___________ 272-4383 ________

l)ari-l)elite 
Drive In

‘Take Out Orders’
210 N. First__________272-4482

First National 
Bank

‘Home Owned’
224 S. Finn

Lambert Cleaners
Steal
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Deadline For Classified Ads Is 

Tuesdays And Fridays

11:00 15. MISCELLANEOUS

CLASSIFIED RATES 
let Insertion, 

per word .11 
Minimum Charge •• 

$1.80

2nd Insertion^ 
and thereafter 
per word -  $.09 

Minimum Charge 
$1.50

CARD OF THANJKS 
25 words -  $3.00 

Over 25 words 
charged at regular 

classified rates 
Classified Display -- 

$1.55 per column inch 
Double Rate for 

Blind Ads. 
DEADLINE FOR 

INSERTION 
11 a.m. Tues.for Thun.

11 a.m. Fi-i. for Sun. 
WE RESERVE THE 
RIGHT TO CLASSIFY, 
REVISE OR REJECT 
ANY AD.

NOT RESPONSIBLE 
FOR ANY ERROR 
AFTER AD HAS RUN 
ONCE.

8. REAL ESTATE FOR 
SALE
* * * * • • • * * * • • * • • • ♦ * * * * * *

THREE LOTS for sale on 
Ivy in Country Club Ad­
dition. Call 214-572-9264 
or 214-572-5628 after 5
p.m.
8-43t-tfc

FOR SALE: 4 bedrooms, 2 
bath, brick, 1-acre in coun­
try. Call 965-2660 after 5 
p.m.
8-2t-tfc

2/3 acre with Mobile 
home, rent house.

Other listings of land and 
houses.

4j»* • • • • • *  * * • • • • • • • * * * * *

1. PERSONALS

WE BUY
USED FURNITURE & 

APPLIANCES 
CALL 272-3030 

\ HARVEYBASS 
APPLIANCE 

lU8s-tfc

Reduce safe and fast with 
Gobese Tablets and E-Vap 
“ water pills”  Damron 
Drug.
I-4t-7ttp

3. HELP WANTED

West Texas Legal Services 
is Accepting Applications' 
for Paralegal in its Plain- 
view office. Responsibili­
ties include: interviewing 
clients, representing
clients before administra­
tive agencies, case invest­
igations, and routine client 
services, all under the 
supervision of an attorney. 
Relevant experience in­
cludes: prior work as a 
paralegal or social case 
worker and /  or education 
and work experience in the 
court system or in the 
areas of specialized law 
involved. Bilingual
English/Spanish extrem­
ely helpful but not requir­
ed. Salary from $9,500.00 
depending on experience. 
Resumes should be sub­
mitted to Ralph Knoohui- 
zen, 1415 West 5th, Plain- 
view, Texas by February 
10th WTLS is an Equal 
Opportunity Employer. 
3-5t-4tc

Interesting sales work in 
rapidly growing field. 
Represent local company 
selling nationally accepted 
product. Top wages for the 
right person. Contact 272- 
5521.
3-7s-ltc

We want your business 
“ remember”
REID REAL ESTATE 
THUR^IE 272-3142 

REID or

Lucille Harp 272-4693
8-50s-stfc

88 ACRES FOR SALE: 
Close into town, 6”  well, 
60 acres in hay, 20 acres 
wheat. Low interest loan. 
Contact 272-5578 from 8 til 
5, 272-3658 after 5 p.m. 
8-49s-tfc

Nice, large brick veneer 
house with 3 bedrooms, 
living room and den, 2 
baths and 2 car garage. 
Also 2 bedroom tenant 
house on 2.05 acres. 
Northwest of Muleshoe.
m  ■ i

.Luge 3 bedroom house 
with 2 baths, living 
room, extra large den 
with fireplace, enclosed 
porch and workroom, 
double carpool in the 
Lenau Addition.
House for Sale at 421 
East Dallas. Has 3 bed­
rooms, 1 3/4 baths, 
living room, one car 
garage, carpet and 
central heat.

Farms Ranches Homes

TOWN and 

COUNTRY

R E A L . E S l A T i
806-272-4678 

JOHN W. SMITH, 
Broker

Call 4307 or 3725 
Muleshoe, Texas 
8-5s-tfc

HOME WORKERS
WANTED: Stuff envelop­
es! We pay 30 cents 
each: Information send
Stamped, self-addressed
envelope to Symtex Enter­
prise, P.O. Box 1501, 
Bloomfield, NJ 07003 
3-1 s-12tc
* * * • * * • » « * « * * • * + * * * * * * * '  • * * *

5. APTS. FOR RENT 
^  * * * * *  * * *  * * *  JlA

Furnished garage apart­
ment, 1 bedroom, pan­
elled, carpeted and water 
is paid. Call 272-3901 after 
5 p.m. or come by 202 W.
5-7s-tfc

*  *  •  *

Good manners are 
good form, even on the

’ udderth Realty, Inc.
Bo* 6 2 7 -  109 5th St 
Farvxll. Taxa 79325 

Phont (905) H 1 1 2 I I  o, 491-9149

160 acres North of Pro­
gress, good water area, 1 
well, priced to sell.

160 Acres northwest of 
Muleshoe, 2 wells, lays 
good, on FM highway.

320 acres irrigated with 2 
electric wells and circles 
all wheat, fenced, excel 
lent water area. Near 
Bovina Feeders.
320 Acres in Lazbuddie 
area, good water area, 
circular sprinkler, 1 mile 
off highway.

160 Acres irrigated, 
Circle Sprinkler, 2 wells, 
200 ft. water plus. 3 
bedroom house, new 
steel barn. On highway 
northwest of Muleshoe.
80 A irrigated with side- 
roll sprinkler, 6 inch 
well. Northwest of Mule­
shoe.
8-50s-tfc

For all your real estate needs 
Call:

GLAZE & GOFORTH 
112 Ave. C 
272-4208

8-lls-tfc

FOR SALE: 1973 model 
Castle Mobile Home 14 x 
68. Call 965-2666.
8-46s-tfc

SMALLWOOD REAL 
ESTATE

272-4838 232 MainStreet 
Joe Smallwood & Ricky 

Sm allwood

907 W . 7th, 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, car port, brick, 
fenced back yard.

New brick homes, 3 bed­
room , 2 bath.
8-43s-tfc

i t u i i m u i f i
KREBBS 

REAL ESTATE 
122 W. Ave. C 
Ph .272-3191 

All Your Real Estate 
Needs.

APPRAISALS
8 - i M r & s

Frank’s
Refrigeration

And
Appliance Service 

315 W . 3rd, M uleshoe 
Phone 272-3822 

15-3 t-8tp

9. AUTOMOBILES FOR 
SALE

FOR SALE: 1979 Datsun 
200 SX. Call Delbert Barry 

■<872-4835 or 272-4236.
*£$s-tfc

For Sale: 1977 LTD 4 Dr. 
Good condition. Call 272- 
4321 or after 6 p.m. call 
272-3482.
9- 5t-4tc

10. FARM EQUIP. FOR 
SALE

FOR SALE: 1 new 6 row 
Lilliston Roll cultivator 
with burning off discs. 1 
new Wylie Spray Rig, 8 
row with 400 gallon poly 
tank, 1 Green gear head • 
75 HP, 1 lot of stand pipes. 
Call 825-3822.
10- 4 7t-tfc

FOR SALE: 60 horse
electric motor. Phone 
806-965-2177. Delter
W enner.
10-51 t-16tp

11. FOR SALE OR TRADE

14x80 Town & Country
Mobile Home. Unfurnish­
ed. To be moved. Equity 
and take up payments. 
Call 505-392-5605 or 505- 
393-1520.
11 -6t-4tc

Have a highly profitable 
JEAN SHOP of your own. 
Featuring the latest in 
Jeans, Denims and Sports­
wear. $16,500 includes be­
ginning inventory, fixtures 
and training. You may 
have your store open in as 
little as 15 days. Call any 
time for Mr Loughlln 612- 
835-1304.
15-6t-2tp

Will do sewing in my 
home. Specialize in
women’ s and childrens 
clothes. Call Gayle Wil­
liams at 4012.
15-7s-tfc

Nice 14X50 2 bedroom 
Mobile Home, 1974 model. 
$7,500. Good watertanks 
on 4 wheel trailer $300. 
Good Catalina Cabinet 
Stereo $100. Seeat l l9  W. 
3rd.
15-6t-tfc

For Fuller Brush Products 
call Elmer Cornelison at 
272-3346. Fuller Brush 
dealers wanted.
15-7s-tfc

STUD SERVICE 
Registered AKC Dober­
man. Call 272-4012. 
15-50s-tfc

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath stucco home, cellar 
and lots of extras, must 
sell. Call 272-4403.

For Sale: 1978 Yahama 
Dirt Bike, Very low mile­
age. Call 927-5415 or 927- 
5433.
11 -St-tfc

FOR SALE- One 403 
Moline motor in good 
shape, with one 50 HP 
Gearhead, in good shape. 
New cooling coil, new 
drive shaft, concrete motor 
stand. $1,400.00 for whole 
package. Call Woody 
Lambert at 272-4726 (days) 
or 272-4889 (nights) or call 
Ricky Barrett at 272-3808. 
11-51 t-tfc .....................

12. HOUSEHOLD GOODS
| | * i * * * * > * < * 9 9 9 9 * * 1 * 4 * 4 *

BURROWS
UPHOLSTERY & FURNI­

TURE REPAIR
118 W. Ave. C

For those who would like 
to control their own labor 
and delivery. Prepared 
Childbirth classes will 
begin February 14th 
Write Eula Ratliff, Box 
126, Muleshoe, Texas.
15- 7s-ltc

* * * * • • * • * • • * • • * • * • * » *

16. LIVESTOCK

^TeTn Country Cattle for 
sale: 30 Angus and Black 
Baldy cows with calves 
up to 400 lbs. 40 mixed 
cows with calves up to 
400 lbs. 70 bred cows 
calving now - Hereford, 
Angus, and black baldy. 
50 bred, cross bred 
heifers weighing 700 lbs.
60 bred, cross bred cows 
weighing 1,000 -
1,200 lbs calving now. 
100 mixed, cross bred 
thin cows - 70 percent 
bred. 10 cross bred cows 
and calves.
16- 7s-2tp

FOR SALE: Workable
piano. Call 272-3622 
15-2s-tfc *»

Have Brush Will Paint 
Calf: Charles Harvey 

806-272-4059
Muleshoe, Texas 79347 
15-5t-8tc

Attention Mr. Cattleman: 
Interested in a cross­
breeding program? Reg­
istered Limousine Bulls for 
sale. Call 946-3497 after 
6 p . m .

15-5t-tfc

PROFESSIONAL DOG 
GROOMING
By a graduate of Barkers 
Barber Grooming Aca­
demy. Call for appoint­
ments 272-3061.
15-49s-tfc
Piano and Voice Lessons 
for adults or children. Call 
272-3622.
15-2s-TFC

t r e f l a n  fo r  sa le
272-4737

W atson Chemical
l5-4s-tfc

Plaster and Stucco Work, 
Call collect 885-2471. Re­
sidential or commercial
15-5s-tfc

When the bell rings 
for lunch, even the best 
worker will stop his labor.

Out of^rbit

C csspckk. P u m p in g  -  Scptic Tank Cleaning  
D ipping  Vats C leaned -• Grease Pits Cleaned 
Flooded C ellars Drained  -  Mud P its C leaned

Davis Cesspool Pumping
DOMESTIC AND COMMERCIAL

••IF IT S PART LIQUID & NOT OVER 20 FT. 
DEEP WE LL TRY TO DRAIN IT."

PH O N E SOS 272-1997 A V E N U E  D

, MULESHOE, TEXAS 7S397 Elmer and Terry Davis
15-2s-8stp p. o. aox 7i

^ S IS itlS ltlS M IIIS IS IS IS IS | »| ia s| t| | | S I9 IIIS

• T V £ Appliance Service •

AREA STUDENTS ATTEND SKI CLASS--Students from Panhandle State University 
recently returned from Red River Ski Basin, where they were enrolled in a physical 
education ski class. The class is an annual course and the student receives one hour 
of college credit. Area students pictured in the class are L to R John Brown, Gate, 
OK; Dirk Abbott, Denton; Clay Bingham, Canyon; Janna Davidson, Richardson; 
Steve Love, Denton; Terry Schafer, Muleshoe; and James Limestald, Yukon, Ok.

Public Notice
PUBLIC NOTICE 

NOTICE TO ALL PER­
SONS HAVING CLAIMS 
AGAINST THE ESTATE 
OF BERT MONROE 
SEALES. DECEASED

Notice is hereby given 
that original Letters of 
Testamentary for the 
Estate of Bert Monroe 
Seales, Deceased were 
issued on February 7, 
1980, in Cause No. 1374, 
pending in the County 
Court of Bailey County, 
Texas, to;

Elisha Don Seales and 
W alter Louis Seales

The residents of Elisha 
Don Seales is Route 5, 
Muleshoe, Texas, and the 
residence of Walter Seales 
is 301 Russwood Drive, 
Rockwall, Texas.

All persons having 
claims against the Estate 
which is currently being 
administered are required 
to present them within the 
time and in the manner 
prescribed by law.

DATED the 7th day of 
February, 1980.

Elisha Don Seales (s) 
Elisha Don Seales 

W alter Louis Seales (s) 
W alter Louis Seales

West Plains 
(Medical Center•; 

Report

ADMITTED 
FEB. 4, Vic Cotton, 

B.O. McDaniel, Johnny 
Richards, John Copley, 
Mallie Davis, Maria A1 
varado, Percilla Quintana 

Feb. 5, Jo Addire May-
hugh, Sara Romas, Mary 
Gom ez

Feb. 6, Brian Woods, 
Brenda Schweers, Ida Col-

Public Notice
CDN-TRACTORS’ NOTICE 

CTF^TEXAS HIGHWAY * 
CONSTRUCTION 

Sealed proposals for 
constructing miles of
Railroad Crossing Ap­
proach Signing & Pave­
ment M arkings 
At Various Locations 

Throughout District 5 
on Highway No. Various 

, covered by RRP 000S 
(117) & RRObOOS(87) in 
Lubbock, Etc. County , 
will be received at the 
State Department of High­
ways and Public Transpor­
tation, Austin, until 9:00 
a.m., February 13, 1980, 
and then publicly opened 
and read.
The State Department of 

Highways and Public 
Transportation, in accor­
dance with the provisions 
of Title VI of the Civil 
Rights Act of 1964 (78 Stat, 
252) and the Regulations 
of the U.S. Department of 
Transportation (15 C.F.R., 
Part 8), issued pursuant to 
such Act, hereby notifies 
all bidders that it will af­
firmatively insure that the 
contract entered into pur­
suant to this advertise­
ment will be awarded to 
the lowest responsible bid­
der without discrimination 
on the ground of race, 
color, or national origin, 
and further that it will 
affirmatively insure that in 
any contract entered into 
pursuant to this adver- 
tisement, minority bus­
iness enterprises will be 
afforded full opportunity to 
submit bids in response to 
this invitation and will not 
be discriminated against 
on the grounds of race, 
color, or national origin in 
consideration for an 
awSTd. Plans and specifi­
cations including mini­
mum wage rates as pro­
vided by Law are available 
at the office of W illiam M . 
Pope , Resident
Engineer, Lubbock. Texas 
and State Department of

tins, Allie Barbour, Danny 
Noble, Inez Garza.

Feb. 7, Nadine Lamp- 
ton, M ichel Isaac.

DISMISSED 
Feb. 4, Cindy Olveral

Feb. 5, Jason Shaw, 
John Copley, Russell 
Burhman, Archie Laur- 
ance, Jim Emerson,
Angelo Costillo and baby 
girl.

Feb. 6, Percila
Quentina, Kellie Mitchell,

Laurie Estrode, Pearlie 
Haskins

Feb. 7, Bulah Gate- 
wood, Julian Jacine, Nellie 
Cook, Pablo Florez, Mary 
Gomez, Sarah Graham.

ENDORSES CONTRACT 
DETROIT ~ A United 

Auto Workers advisory 
group has overwhelmingly 
endorsed a scaled-down con­
tract granting significant 
cash concessions to the 
troubled Chrysler Corp.

MEET
CANDIDATES

Rates for listing in the Journal’ s Political Column 
is; $35 for all offices except those for City Council and 
School Board post which is $15. This fee includes a 
front page announcement article and a one-column 
photograph at the time the announcement is made, in 
addition to the listing in the Political Column from the 
date of announcement until the final election.

Charges for announcements are cash in advance, 
and this same policy applies to all political 
advertising carried in the columns of this news paper.

Names for each office will be listed in the Political 
Column in the order they are received at the 
newspaper office.

The Journal has been authorized to announce the 
following candidates for public office:

DEMOCRATIC
★  STATE SENATE ★  

DISTRICT 31
Gerald McCathern 

Bill Sarpalius

★  COMMISSIONER ★  
Precinct 1

Raymond Scott 
Marshall (Catfish) Williams 

Chester Embry 
L.K. (Kenyon ) Dean

Precinct ID 
R.P. (Bob) Sanders

★  REPRESENTATIVE ★
Bill Clayton

★  SHERIFF ★
Boh Henderson

Jerry Hicks 
J.D. (Pete) Black

★  DISTRICT ATTORNEY ★  
Jack Young

★  COUNTY ★
Tax Assessor

Lavayne Williams

REPUBLICAN
★  COMMISSIONER ★
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Nursing 
Home News

By Joy Stancell

JUNIOR HIGH ALL-REGION BAND MEMBERS--Members of the All-Region band 
chosen from Muleshoe Junior High School recently included from left, back row; 
Tommy Carlson, Jimmy Holmes and Chris Hernandez, all Tuba; Brenda Flowers, 
saxophone; Michelle Berry, clarinet; Barbi Seaton, clarinet; second row, from left,
Shelly Sain, Donna Horn and Tond*# Gunstream, all flute and front row, Dan 
Bouchelle, trombone.

MHS STUDENTS PLAYED WITH ALL-REGION BAND -Chosen to play with the 
All-Region Band in Lubbock recently were in the students shown here; from left, top 
row, Christine Isaac, and Eric Allison, both baritone and Robert King, trombone; 
third row, from left, Adam Laredo, alto sax; Tena Landers, clarinet; Tracey Webb, 
saxophone and Steve Claybrook, trombone; second row, from left, Minerva Martinez 
and Laura Leal, trombone and Melissa Allison, bass clarinet.

OFFICIAL RECORDS
MARRIAGE LICENSE 

Randal Wayne Mar­
low and Zoe Johnette 
Jones, both of Muleshoe.

Edward Robert Gonza­
les, Muleshoe and Liza- 
beth Gloria Chavez, 
Farwell.

Jammie Bass, Jr. and 
Alyne Lucille Lookadoo 
both of M uleshoe.

WARENTEE DEEDS 
T.A. Miller to Emma 

Ruth Vaughn and Loetta 
Elaine Coburn, All of 
(SE/4) of Section, No. (37), 
Block Z, WD and FW 
Johnson Subdivision.

Kay King Burrow, spa 
Kay King to Kenneth 
King, A retangular tract of 
land 65' by 140', and being 
(SW'ly 20') of Lot No. (2) 
and the (NE’ ly 45’ ) of Lot 
No. (3) in Block No. (4), 
Golf Course Addition.

Donald W. Chesser to 
Danny Joe Shipman, All of 
Lot No. (20), Block No. (5), 
of Lenau Subdivision.

Don Nickels to Nickels 
Gin-Goodland, A Texas 
General Partnership, All 
undivided interest in fol­
lowing property, TRACT 
#1, A (12) acre tract of land 
out of the (S/2) of (SW /A) 
of Section No. (48), Block 
C, Melvin, Blum and Blum 
Survey, in Bailey County. 
TRACT II, a tract of land 
210’ by 561’ , approximate­
ly 2.67 acres, out of (S/2) 
of(S W /4) of Section (48) in 
Block C, Melvin, Blum and 
Blum Survey in Bailey 
County.

Elmer Lee and wife, 
LaJuana Lee to Nickels 
Gin-Goodland, All undi­
vided interest in following 
property, TRACT 1, A )12) 
acre tract of land out of the 
(S/2) of (SW /4) of Section 
No. (48), Block C, Melvin, 
Blum and Blum Survey, in 
Bailey County. TRACT II. 
A tractofland 210' by 561' 
approximately 2.67 acres, 
out of (S/2) of (SW/4) of 
Section (48) in Block C, 
Melvin, Blum and Blum

COUNTY COURT 
Rudy Toscano - Crim­

inal Mischief - S40 fine 
Maria Vidaurri - Order 

of Dismissal
DISTRICT COURT 
Dib Hays VS Winston 

Wilson and Marion Wilson 
- Judgement

Olivea M. Spurlock VS 
Lindsey Manufacturing 
Company and Ken Vickers 

Order of Dismissal. 
Muleshoe State Bank VS 

Mrs. Shirley B. Williams 
aka Shirley B. Crump - 
Judgement.

Sylvia K. Smoak VS 
Thomas S. Freeman 
Judgem ent

ULjjfl{ i
It takes 50 years to replace 
a forest destroyed by fire.

Thursday afternoon 
members of the Sr. Citi­
zens came to play 42 with 
Ora Roberts, Russ Dun­
can, Charlie Garth, Grace 
Kemp, Johnnie West­
brook, Archie Scarlett 
watched the games.

*****
i

Friday morning Mrs. 
Dawson came to help the 
residents make and bake 
cookies. The residents en­
joyed eating them and 
sharing with the other re­
sidents and staff. Resi­
dents participating were: 
Ora Roberts, Russ Dun­
can, Grace Kemp, Marie 
Engram, Maggie London, 
Archie Scarlett, Marie Pat­
ton and Charlie Garth.

Sunday afternoon the 
Circle Back and Needmore 
singers came to sing to the 
residents. Residents at­
tending were: Josie Ross, 
Marie Engram, Bertie 
Hendrix, Maggie London, 
Annie Brown, Edith
Bruns, Roie Stein, Ora 
Roberts, Russ Duncan, 
Charlie Garth and Archie 
Scarlett.

Sunday morning E.B. 
Wilson came to have Bible 
Study with Marie Patton, 
Russ Duncan, Maggie 
London, Edith Bruns, 
Marie Engram, Sena 
Burhman, Dottie Wilterd- 
ing, Annie Brown, Archie 
Scarlett and Charlie Garth. 

*****
Friday, February 1, 

Rev. Joe Stone and Mrs. 
Stone and ladies from the 
Assembly of God Church 
came to give a Devotional 
to the residents. Rev. and 
Mrs. Joe Stone sang 
several songs for the re­
sidents and the ladies and 
residents sang. Rev. Joe 
Stone read a Bible reading 
in Psalms. Refreshments 
of Ice Cream and Cake 
were served to the resi­
dents.

OPEN!
8 7 6 0

hours
a

year
. . . t he 
hour hank

_ m u l e s h o e !
STATE BANK

101 AMERICAN BLVD. •  272-4561'* Member FDIC

Announcing....
Roy Whitt Chevrolet 
Proudly Announces 
That Doug Crawford 
Is Now Their New 

Salesman. /

{

Doug Is The Son Of Mr.
&Mrs. Jimmie Crawford,
A M.H.S. Graduate &

Attended West Texas State 
University.

Crawford Is Married To The Former 
Tanya Burton.

Doug Crawford

Roy Whitt Is Proud To Have Doug

Associated With His Organization.

R oy Whitt Chevrolet

*****

Visiting Ora Roberts 
were Roland McCormick, 
Johnny Dale Cooper, Mrs. 
Cockran, Mrs. Calvin 
Cook, Mrs. Jane Hughs. 
Visiting her Monday were 
Jeff Sliger, Marvin Arren- 
dondo, Tom Sliger, Essie 
Hall, Dulsie Hunt and
Mrs. Stevens.

*****

Bertie Hendrix, was

visited by Essie Hall and 
Mrs. Hunt. She went to 
her grandaughters Tues­
day, to spend the day and
get a perm.

*****

Ida Collins was visited 
by her niece, Mrs. James 
Steel and her son.

Russ Duncan was visited 
by Mrs. D.C. Stovall.

Marie Patton went
grocery shopping with her
daughter June Gore.

*****
Lula Trout was visited 

by her daughter, Charlene
and her grand sons.

*****
Clara Weaver, was

visited by Lorene Gallman 
Sunday. Mrs. Pruitt also
visited Sunday.

*****

Sena Burhman 
visited by Mrs. King, htr 
daughter, Mrs. Maddox.

1
Grace Kemp, W|J 

visited by Mr. and Mrs, 
Don Kemp, Argilee and 
her great grandson, Kin,,

Terry Bouchelle visited
the Nursing Home.

* * * * *
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Bingo Winners Have 
Brighter Winter Daysl
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Split With Back 'n Gibleta

Split Fivers or 
Box-O-Chickon

lb .

Fresh Fryer Breasts
Legs or Thighs . 8 8 *
U.S.D.A. Grade A 
Fryer Parts

Glover 
Bulk

Chorizo’s

lb.

Diet or Regular n r  IVf t

Pepsi Cola Dew
6-pack 32-oz. btlt.

R *tu rn *b l*

Cf*4M

I4*

1G G LY
IIG C L Y

ICE CRt.fcM

.rum

Piggly Wiggly Assorted Flavors

Ice Cream

From Nsbisco

Chips Altov]

13-ox.

Va gal. 
Ctn.

Yellow Onions

5
lbs

Broccoli

Long Green, Slicera

Cucumbers

!0

Kraft. Halt Moon

Longhorn

Cheddar Cheese 10-OI.
P*B

59

New Crop Minnelo

Tangelos

3
lbs

White Swan

Tomato
Sauce

Frit os
lovi-oz.

>1 *

Washington State
Rad or Gold.

Delicious 
Apples .

Crisp Green 

Stalk

Celery*


